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COULD WAVE BEEN 
Walter Winchcll, world’s cham- 

pion gossip, and one who is fre­
quently and egotistically wrong, is 
proposing that it must have been 
the German polico who set o ff the 
beer hall explosion that so adroit­
ly  missed Hitler last week. The 
object o f such a brutal expedient 
would be to chargo Britian, he 
argues, and thus stir Germany to 
superhuman fury against tho Al­
lies. It is not unreasonable to c r  
pact such unreasonable activities o f 
the German leader. His warped 
thinking could as well suggest such 
a thing as it must have suggested 
many o f tho things he has done. 
Meanwhllo, the quietness o f tho 
Western Front is startling.

BEING CHILDISH 
We can not see why Governor 

< /Daniel ever thought—if he really 
<ild—that Texas legislators would 
agree without debate to adopt any 
measure as important as one that 
would raise the twenty million do! 
lars or more he proposed to raise 
b y  his mail referendum. We think 
o f  two good reasons why he should 
not havo expected to have his plan 
approved: First, the lawmakers are 
responsible to their constituents
and not to the governor. There arc 
■few who might owe their elections 
to him and none who would admit 
•it Those legislators were thinking 
o f  their obligations to the elector­
ate in the session just closed and 
still they have it in mind. The sec­
ond reason /«•" "^approval is that 
debutff^Tone ot tlm'essentials*of 
democracy. Without differences of 
opinion and open discussions of 
vital and controversial questions, 
many would not have opportunity 
to judge from careful study the re­
sults that might come from any en­
actment of the legislature. Wo think 
the Governor was just being child­
ish again.

• • • •

85c A BOLL
We cite this week for achieve­

ment, Douthlt Grinstcad, a mem­
ber of the Slaton F. F. A. for his 
prise winning cotton bolls. He has 
been cultivating the Paymaster 
strain of cotton and making some 
splendid showings of it. This year 
he made on exhibit of twenty bolls 
—as required by show rules—and 
at the South Plains Fair and at 
the Dallas Fair, he took prizes ag 
gregating 817.00, which figures 
out tho said 85c a boll. And he still 
owns the bolls. Cotton is still the 
chief cash crop of the South Plains 
Improved strains of cotton will 
help make cotton pay better for 
the time and effort and land de­
voted to it. Tho careful breeding 
and record keeping at the hands of 
a young man make promise for the 
future.

Slaton Resident 
Dies At Age 82

Mrs. Sally Weir, 82, and resident 
o f Slaton, died at her home last 
week. She was born at the home of 
her parents October 81, 1857 in 
Talipusa County, Alabama. She

'ubs Take Tigers 
n Armistice Game

Slow Starting Locals 
)rop Chance At Title
Start a drive, fumble the ball, 

and when tho smoko clears, tho 
enomy has seven points. Start an­
other drive, fumble tho ball, and 
when the smoko clears, the homo 
team is fourteen points behind. 
Another drive, an intercepted pass 
and the champions have u lead of 
twenty points. It looks bad. It is 
bad. Too bad.

But there came a rallying point. 
The Tigers started another drivo 
First down and eighty yards to go, 
They went. All the way. Eighty 
yards without losing the ball. Also 
the extra point was scored. Thir­
teen points behind. Then another 
drive. Right downn the field 
Straight football. No fooling, and 
no fumbling. Seventy or eighty 
yards. All the way. And the point 
was good. Six points behind.

But time can’t be beaten. And 
the Tigers after driving half the 
length of the field, lost the ball in 
the last minute o f play and the 
game ended 20-14, favoring ihe in­
vading Brownfield Cubs. Outweigh­
ed and outplayed for tho longer 
half of the game the Tigers gave a 
good accounting o f themselves in 
the deciding game of the season, 
Two thousand fans watched them,: 
half o f them enjoying half tho 
game, the other half enjoying the 
other half o f the game. So a good 
time was had by all.

Statistics: First downs, Tigers,

GIGANTIC ARMISTICE OBSERVED; 
FLORENCE HEADS PARADE HERE
RMASets Holiday 
November 39th

• Ewa Jean Enlow Is 
Crowned Queen

1C. Cubs, 14; Penetrations, Tigers,
2, Cubs, 1; passes completed 1 for 
8 yards, Cubs, 3 for8C yards; not 
completed, G and 0; intercepted, 1 
and 2; fumbles recovered by oppon­
ent, 2 and G; yardage of kicks, 3 
for an average of 31, and 3 for 22; 
r&chi*ld<v ponalizod 5 times for a 
total of 35 yards.

Brownfield's first score was on 
a pas from Brown to Bowers, 28 
yards; their second touchdown a 
pass Brown to Bryan, 50 yards, 
and their third Tankersley ran 41 
yards on an intercepted pass.

Collier and Austin scored for 
Slaton, Scott kicking for point each 
time.

The Retail Mercchant’s Associa 
tion met in regular meeting Mon­
day afternoon at the Secretary’s 
office. The secretary reported on 
the State meeting of last morith 
Action was taken on the matter of 
tho Welfare League, which was 
approved in principle. A report 
was made on the activities o f a hot 
checker who was through town last 
week cashing what purported to be 
a labor check from South Plains 
gin. The check form had been stol­
en and the signature forged. One 
local business man cashed the 
check for fifteen dollars. The forg­
er had not been apprehended at the 
latest report.

No little discussion was had 
about impending holidays. How­
ever, tho RMA would have it 
known that it approves and urges 
the observance of four holidays 
each year, July 4th, Armistice, 
Thanksgiving and Christmas. Three 
of these occur within the next 60 
days. Most o f the merchants in the 
city have already pledged them 
selves to close their places o f busi­
ness November Eleventh. The con­
fusion attending the shift, in 
Thanksgiving as proclaimed by the 
President of the United States was 
discussed, but in deference to tra­
dition, and to the plans of so many 
people and organizations that have 
been mode for a year or more, the 
Slaton RMA adopted as official for 
the RMA tho LAST THURSDAY 
IN NOVEMBER. Tho Executive 
Committee took this move only as 
a recommendatory measure, since 
it can not issue mandates, and 
does not care to issue proclama­
tions. .

Slaton Officers 
Nab Lynn Suspect
Drew Enloe Arrested 
At Local Stockyards

Acting upon advices from the 
Lynn County Sheriff, Slaton police 
officore, R. L. Wicker, Louie Ares, 
and Chas. Yates arrested Drew En­
loe at the stock pens cast o f the 
city early Sunday morning. Enioe 
it is reported, admitted an affray 
with Clen Browning of the Grass­
land Community. Browning died 
early. Sunday morning from gun­
shot wounds allegedly inflicted by

I Enioe.
Enloe was found asleep by local

Weather not too bright and not 
too warm still encouraged the at­
tendance o f thousands at the com 
bined Education Week and Armis­
tice Parade in Slaton the morning 
of the Eleventh.

Colorful bands and floats from 
the various departments of Sla­
ton's Public Schools took part in

road Avenue for tho march down

Hospital Plan Is 
Talked At Rotary

t the ago of eigh- 
a devoted Chris-

moved to T 
teen and h' 
tian life.

She wasSferrled to E. W. Weir 
•t the age «  twenty-three. Ten 
children were born into this union, 
three dying in infancy. Surviving 
sure her husband, C. W. Weir, Mrs. 
Nettle Luman, Slaton, Lige Weir, 
Commerce, Mrs. Pearl Darby, W il­
son, Mrs. Ebble Jenkins, Strong 
City, Oklahoma, Wyant Weir, Sla­
ton, and Mrs. Jeneva Legett, Abi­
lene; also thirty-nine grandchildren 
and twenty-six great grandchildren

EXTENDS THANKS

The Woodrow Wilson teachers 
and pupils wish to express their ap­
preciation for the donations for 
the decorations of the float from 
the Slaton Merchants and friends.

Woodrow Wilson Teachers 
and Pupils.

A Picture To 
Thrill All Slaton!

Starring Gary Cooper, and with 
Andrea Leeds and David Niven 
heading an unusually important 
cast, “ The Real Glory,’ ’ which will 
have its premiere showing at the 
Palace Theatre at Saturday’s pro- 
vuc und Sunday and Monday, un­
folds n thrilling and exciting tale 
of the Philliplno Scouts and their 
heroic bravery at the conclusion 
of the Spanish-American War, 
when the Phillipinos were overrun 
by insurrectionists and religious 
fanatics.

The central theme of “ Tho Real 
Glory, revolves around the ex­
ploits of the scouts,' who became 
a constabulary on the island and 
rallied to their support loyal na­
tives and peaceful Moros. The 
Moros, a tribo o f unorjthodox Mo­
hammedans, had retreated to the 
hills and jungles of the Sulu King­
dom to wage a fierce religious war 
against tho remaining American 
troops.

For tho first time ii) his career, 
Cooper plays the role '6t a doctor, 
who comes to this distant outpost 
for medical experience. He remains 
to help the Army quell tho rebel­
lion and establish lasting peace 
Miss Leeds in the role of an Amer­

ican  visiting her father, also stays 
on—not to win the war, but to win 
a trip to the altar on the arm of 
Gary.

For weeks a corps o f 500-odd 
workmen labored to complete a re­
plica o f a regular army post in the 
Philliplnes for this picture, and the 
results are startling. The space oc 
cupicd by the set comprised six 
acres, and 40,000 square feet o f as­
phalt were used for a lagoon 40 
feet long and six feet deep, con­
taining 1,500,000 gallons o f water. 
This vast body o f water wasn't 
static for a minute for a pumping 
plant was set up to maintain a na­
tural current in the stream and a 
six-inch head of water tumbled 
constantly over a six-foot waterfall.

C. E. Hunt, Superintendent of 
Lubbock Sanitarium, and H. D. 
Woods of Lubbock talked to the 
Rotary Club last week about the 
group . hospitalization plan in 
which most Texas hospitals are 
combining to give hospital service 
to subscribers at cost. Tho plan re­
quires the payment of monthly 
dues and entitles policy holders to 
a given number o f days hospitali­
zation each year. Other guests of 
the club were Rev. T. D. O’Brien, 
Clint Herring and Dr. B. E. Young 
o f Post.

Texas and around the square. Vari­
ous businesses and civic organiza­
tions financed the floats that re­
flected the life and thought of the 
community and nation.

E w a Jean Enlow, pretty 17-ycar 
old daughter o f Mr. and Mrs. C. C. 
Enlow, was crowned during the 
parade by J. C. Tucker. Miss En­
low was selected from the senior 
class by members o f the student 
body.

Riding with W. P. Florence, first 
Slaton school superintendent was 
E. R. Legg, president o f tho school 
board, J. H. Teague, sr, mayor, and 
Joe E. Webb, school superintend­
ent.

Immediately following were the 
East Ward school rhythm band, 
East Ward school float; West 
Ward rhythm band; West Ward 
school float, bicycle division, guid­
ance float, with Mrs. J. G. Wilhite, 
float, V. Bevington Reed, coach; 
sponsor; Junior High athletic 
Senior high school band, Jim Ncv- 
ins, director; queen’s float, with 
Miss Enlow; social science float, 
Miss b(pud Dean, director.

Natural science float, J. G. Wil­
hite, director; commercial float, 
Mr. and Mrs. R. M. Nash, direc­
tors; agricultural 'float, A. C. 
Strickland, director; high school 
athletic group, Coaches Curtis 
Hamilton and Jack Miller, directors 
Spanish float, Melvin Sisk, direc­
tor; student council float, Princi­
pal Roy Boyd, director; home eco­
nomics float, Miss Phyllis Drake, 
director; East Ward and Junior 
High P.T.A. float.

The parade started on North 
Texas Avenue, and in the after­
noon the game to decide the virtual 
champion of the southern half o f 
District 5-A was played in the Tig' 
er Stadium at 2:30 o'clock.

officers as they combed the local 
stockyards. So soundly was the 
fugitive sleeping, the officers at 
first thought he was dead. He pro­
fessed surprise when told Brown­
ing was dead, claiming he had 
shot at the man, but had thought 
he had missed his mark. He was 
lodged in the county jail, where he 
was being held with his brother, L. 
A. Enloe, pending action on charges 
filed by Lynn County peace offi­
cers.

Mrs. Dick Odom spent several 
days in Littlefield Inst week visit­
ing Mr. and Mrs. E. O. Mclver, 
former Slaton residents. Mr. Mclv- 
cr has been seriously ill with pneu­
monia.

Red Cross Drive 
Closes Saturday

With the city divided into zones 
business district and industrial 
centers, Slaton’s key workers for 
the American Red Cross launched 
the annual drive here Tuosday 
morning, and announced that well 
over 100 memberships had been 
sold lato Tuesday afternoon. Ray­
mond Leo Johns, local Red Cross 
chairman, said he expected the drive 
to net somewhere in the neighbor­
hood of 15“  members before the 
close of the soliciting Saturday of 
this week.

Workers for the residential and 
business sections of the city were 
Mrs. C. C- Hoffman, jr .,w h o  was 
appointed vice-chairman of the 
drive, Mrs. Wado Thompson, Mrs. 
R. C. Sanner, Mrs. W. T. Cherry, 
Mrs. J. A. Elliott, Mrs. Raymond 
Champion, Mrs. Raymond Lee 
Johns, Mrs. Pete Ilaliburton, Mrs. 
Levi Self, and Mrs. Vcrn Johnson, 
Jr. »

Key workers in the schools were 
Roy Boyd, high school; K. S. Mc­
Kinnon, East Ward, and John C. 
Jenkins, West Ward and Junior 
High.

George Brnsscll was named key 
worker in tho city’s cotton oil mil­
ling plant, while workers in differ­
ent divisions of the railway plants 
were Warren Henry and L. B. Hag- 
erman.

Thanksgiving 
November 30
Business, Civic, City, 
All Agree on Date

Slaton’s Official Thanksgiving 
will be November 30, after action 
has been taken by tho Retail Merch 
ant’s Association, the Chamber of 
Commerce, the Rotary Club, the 
Post Office and various business 
men who aro not connected with 
any of the above named organiza­
tions.

The Rotary Club several weeks 
ago adopted tho idea of having 
Thanksgiving luncheon November 
23, and omitting the meeting of 
November 30. The Retail Merch 
ant's Association was next to take 
action, and along with the Cham­
ber of Commerce, took the view 
that schools and colleges hod all 
made plans for a year or more to 
observe the 30th, and that the short 
notice o f a few weeks was not suf­
ficient to change plans.

Mayor Teague, in an interview 
Monday, announced that ho would 
proclaim whatever day was accep 
table to the business organizations 
but he hoped November 30 would be 
the day, since tradition and practice 
had fixed the day, at least for this 
year. Postmaster K. L. Scuddcr 
announced Tuesday evening that 
the Post Office would be open tho 
twenty-third and would close tho 
thirtieth for holiday, pursuant to 
the expression of the business con­
cerns of tho city.

Official reports from other South 
Plains Counties and cities indicate 
that most o f them will observo 
November 30th for official Thanks­
giving.

Board of City Development and 
Chamber of Commerce News

RAYMOND LEE JOHNS, MANAGER

Slaton ginners announce that our 
cotton gathering season is almost 
over, with butween 05 and 100 per 
cent of the cotton already in the 
bale and released from the gin. 
Four gins report that 6,832 bales 
have been received. This falls con­
siderably short o f the figures for 
last year; howover, when wo look 
at the figures for somo of dur sur­
rounding towns and counties wo 
feel somewhat better when we 
learn that we have dono consider­
ably better right hero at home than 
havo some of our neighbors.

THE MEANS AT 
OUR DISPOSAL

Thero is scarcely any man or 
woman o f affairs in Slaton who 
docs not have in mind something 
he would like to see dono to better 
conditions in our own civic and 
commercial life. Not that condi­
tions aro essentially bad, but be­
cause they know and feel that 
there is always room for improve­
ment if we are not to stand still.

I f these people were to get to­
gether and formulate a program of

being the case it seems logical for 
each o f us, before attempting to 
arrango a program o f our own 
with no means of making it effec­
tive, to align our energies behind 
the chamber o f commerce program 
and help accomplish tho things it 
is trying to do for our city.

The trouble with most o f us is 
that we arc ftiorc interested in our 
own ideas o f what should be done, 
and how, than wo are with the 
means at our disposal for carrying 
out those very ideas. Tho means 
is the chamber o f commerce, and 
the more intelligently we cooper­
ate with it the more we can nccom- 
lish for tho good of Slaton.

Please give us your suggestions 
before we outline our new pro­
gram o f work for 1040.

There has been much discussion 
in this and other cities as to which 
day will be observed as Thanks­
giving day. This organisation had 
occasion to discuss the matter in 
its most recent regular meeting 
Tuesday evening, Nov. 4, and it 
was the concensus o f opinion and 
became a matter o f record as a

Deer Season Opens, 
Hunters Fare Forth

Already several Dcendayers have 
been out into the wilds and come 
back with meat to go on the tables 
for the crying children. W. M. 
Rust went to Ncvadn and bagged 
n juicy buck. Louie Arcs tried the 
New Mexico climate and found it 
fatal to one buck. This week a party 
of seven fared forth to Mason Co. 
with lethal intentions toward tho 
white tail deer abounding in those 
parts. John and E. E. Crow of Abcr 
nathy, O. O. Crow, R. L. Wicker, 
Vnskar Browning, Otis Neill and 
Jack Watkins of Slaton left Tues­
day morning. Since the season 
opened Thursday, no further re­
ports are available at this writing. 
But from the record the same party 
hung up last year, there is no doubt 
that local butcher shops will see 
a decided slump when the hunters 
return.

commercial betterment thoy might motion, duly made, seconded and 
be surprised to find how closely (carried that we should observe the 
it would approximate the program lest Thursday in this month, or 
o f our chamber of commerce. This (November 30, at Thanksgiving day.

City Officials Go 
To New Braunfels

Mayor Joe If. Teague, sr., and 
City Secretary E. H. Ward- left 
Tuesday morning for Now Braun­
fels to attend the 27th Annual Con­
vention of the League of Texas 
Municipalities, which opened there 
at ten o ’clock Wednesday. They 
plan to return Sunday.

The local officers are alert to 
the needs o f tho city and this op­
portunity will be taken to study 
together with other Texas city of<

First Welfare Drive 
Completed This Week

The officers o f the Slaton Wel­
fare League feel that tho first an­
nual drive for funds was a success, 
for such a new venture. The ma­
jority of the people contacted by 
the drive workers responded with 
an active interest in the purposes 
of the League and loyal support of 
its program.

Several divisions and workers 
have not yet completed their re­
ports, but at this date over one 
hundred and fifty dollars in cash 
and fifty dollars in pledges have 
been turned in to the treasurer. 
Solicitors arc still working in some 
groups and many people who did 
not pledge definite amounts have 
promised to support the League Int­
er in the year.

This is Slaton’s own organization. 
All o f the money raised remains in 
Slaton, it is our community wel­
fare fund. It’s responsibilities arc 
our responsibilities. You arc urged 
to take an interest in its work dur­
ing the coming year.

Eastern Star 
Banquets Masons

Slaton Masons were tho guests 
o f the Order of tho Eastern Star 
at an annual banquet Thursday 
night of last week at the Masonic 
Temple on Garza Street. The tables 
were decorated with flowers of 
the season and laden with foods of 
holiday variety nnd plenty. The 
occasion is one looked forward to 
from year to year by the members 
of Slaton Masonic order, and the 
women of the Eastern Star take 
delight in honoring the group of 
men who make possible their or- 
organization.

There was a surprising lack of 
apccclynaking, Mrs. Prosser spoke 
briefly a few words of welcome. 
Rev. W. F. Ferguson spoke the in­
vocation and the dinner was served. 
After the meal a Master Mason’s 
Idflge was opened for business.

Father O f Mrs. J. D. 
Norris Dies Sunday

Band Concert 
Given Monday
Crowded House At 
Annual Fall Recital

Slaton High school band, under 
direction of James B. Ncvins, pre­
sented its fall concert Monday even 
ing, November 13, at 7:30 in the 
high school auditorium. Dicky Rags 
dale and Frankie Todd assisted 
Novins during the evening’s pro­
gram, which consisted of: 

“ Finlandia," chorale by J. Sibel­
ius; "Carmen," Bizet, arranged by 
G. E. Holmes and directed by Rags­
dale; "Selections from Schubert," 
Franz Schubert; "Nola,”  by Felix 
Arndt, played as a saxaphone solo 
by Donald Cherry, accompanied by 
Donna Maud Sanner at the pleno; 
“ Largo," by Handel, directed by 
Todd; "Hongroisc," overture by 
Schornicka, to be used as a contest 
number by the band this year; 
“ Gypsy Dance,”  played as a wood­
wind quintet, written by F. Danzi; 
the players, Lori Anne Young, 
flute, Teddy Swanner, oboe, James 
Thornton, bassoon, Frank Gyles, 
clarinet, and F. L. Wells, French 
hom; "Jeanie with the Light Brown 
Hair,”  Stephen Foster; and “ Man­
tilla," Spanish overture written by 
Paul Yoder.

Playing in the concert, listed with 
their instruments, were: Mike Wat­
kins, piccolo; Malcolm Sanders, 
Anno Evans, Eva Ruth Hope, Billy 
Klattcnhoff and Miss Young, flutes 
Billy Guinn and Swanner, oboes; 
Thornton, bassoon; Billy Lokey 
and Bernadine Grabber, alto clari­
nets; Cloyd Stanford and Earl 
Green, bass clarinots; Billie Rust, 
Ragsdale and Cherry, alto saxa- 
phones; J. E. Eckert and Marie 
Cosgrove, tenor safaphoncs; Chas. 
Reese, baritone saxaphone. ___

Frank Gyles, Paul Melton, M. G. 
Davis, Marion Holden, Jas. Smith, 
Lannon Smith, Jenny Lou Garland, 
Dolcnc Grabber, Gerald Stokes, 
Jean Rankin, Glen Scroggins, Don- 
nld Groshart, Tommy Davis, Jackie 
Berkley, Lois Thompson, Barbara 
Bates, Wallace Cooper, Bill Daw­
son, Raymond Champion, clarinets; 
Kenneth Tanner, George Haltom, 
Junior Jones, Joe Lloyd Ward, 
Bobby Burton, Earl Bradshaw, Joe 
Rankin, Buck Bourne, Kenneth 
Lilley, Billy Ray Sanner, cornets; 
F. L  and Berwyn Wells, Bill Cher­
ry, Leon McReynolds, French 
horns; Leroy Lively nnd Joe Vic­
tor Hnrvoy, baritones.

Louie Cates, Howard Young, A. 
R. Golding, R. B. Senrs and Todd, 
trombones; J. C. Burton, Bill Grab­
ber, Everett Robertson, J. D. Ran­
kin. Duane Hope, James Kccse, 
basses; Jimmie Fnye Ward, bells; 
D. W. Walston, Vivian Murphrcc, 
Billy Bob Tibbs, Erma Wilson, 
Sam Ares, drums.

A. L. Suits, 74, and fnlhcr of 
Mrs. J. D. Norris, died at his horn* 
in Jnyton, Sunday, Nov. 12.

Burial was in the Jayton Ceme- 
tern Monday afternoon. He is sur­
vived by his wife, a daughter, Mrs. 

ficials on tho problems and pro-J J. D. Norris, Slaton; two sons, J.
gross o f city 
management

government and

Job Printing Neatly Done.

L. Suits o f Lockney, 
Suits o f Plainview.

and A. L.

Lot our Want A b  do your work.

aO fflfe

Mrs. H. Verkamp 
Dies Sun., Nov. 12

Mrs. Herman Verkamp, 60, died 
at her home south of town, Sunday, 
November 12, after a lingering 
illness. Funeral services were held 
in S t  Joseph’s Catholic Church, 
November 14, with Rev. T. D. 
O'Brien officiating. Burial was in 
Englewood cemetery under tho di­
rection of Williams Funoral Home.

Pallbearers were Joseph Grab­
ber, Charles Buxkempcr, D. Kolod- 
ziejezyk, R. J. Bednarz, John Cos­
grove and M. F. Braden.

Six grandchildren were flower- 
carriers. They were Gladys Marie 
and Tommy Bednarz, Bobby, Pat­
sy and Lucilc Verkamp and Jimmy 
Schneider.

Mrs. Vcrkanp, a native of Ferdi­
nand, Indiana had lived in 8taton 
since 1921.

Survivors are her husband, Her­
man Verkamp, five daughters, 
Mrs. Augusta Blume, Miss Minnie 
Verkamp, Mrs. Alphonse Bednarz, 
bliss Marie Verkamp and Mrs. Her­
man Schneider all o f Slaton; seven 
sons, Leo of Laurence, Nebr., Harry 
of Ferdinand, Ind., Edwin, Roman, 
Sylvester, Gilbert, Martin, all o f 
Slaton; two sisters, Mrs. Therese 
Evers, Evansville, Ind., and Mrs. 
Elisabeth Verkamp, Ferdinand, Ind. 
one brother, Frank Hoveless, o f Ire 
land, Ihd.; a sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Ben Hoveless; two brother-in-laws, 
Gar hard Verkamp aad Frank Hog*.

m  \
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Now for the Mirror 
And Old Piano Stool THE SUNNY SIDE OF LIFEBjr RUTH WYETH SPEARS

T HE illustration shows what be­
came of' the m irror and piano- 

■tool which the bride had; left ovec 
last week. TV),, the mirooc and: 
■tool were added; two. wooden 
boxes from the grocery. These 
were placed on end about 18 
inches apart and a shelf of Vi- 
inch pine screwed to the top. A 
frame was then screwed to the 
back of the boxes as shown here. 
A curtain rod w s placed across 
the top and the mirror hung 
lengthwise under it. An arm was 
then hinged to the front of each

B A B Y  C H ICK S

CHICKS!Clean Comics That W ill Amuse Both Old and Young
STOVE REPAIRSBy ED W H E E L A N

REPAIRS^UdO .TM C ruROPCAH GIANT” MA30P SPCCK.THE MIDGET -  LCfTTA.TWC fAT 
GIRL -  ALMA.'THE ALB1MO -  PROP. HORACE. CORE ,TWE AWROlO&ER -  
SAILOR 6 t(T2 , TWC TATT&OCO MAM -  MMC. FRINGE-, THC eeAROEO LAOY -
VNOOP, IRE naJILPMAN.ANO KU-KU.THE e i r o G i r l , a l l  Ca m e  f o r w a r d . -

MOW s e e  MERC -A LL OP 
M x> -  X  WANT N O  MORE 
R A Z Z IN G  O P  BCN K iy J! 
I’LL FIRE THE FIRST ONE 
WHO TR IES Tt> V<IO HIM 
A S  AIN -  DO VOU 

S. UNDERSTAND THAT V - .

®EAVING THE EXASPERATED* CCNNy.THE 
©ARKER*. 3EFF ENTERED THE 3IDe 3HQM

'CURTAIN ■'a l l  RIGHT. 
EVERyfeCToy 
D O W N

GEE. HUGO, T ^ >  
WONDER WHAT'S 
U P ?  r——~

SCREWED 
TO w—— 
MCX 1~
OF. |f~

SCH O O LS

O raiiK bn o ’i  r * c « l » *  » » » >  
p u tlU u n , lh a n  tb « r  e a n  II  
u o w  bow  to  f e l  e  J o b  *ooD<

OUle. tari«a/*r Gel

OF BOXES AND HINGED ARMS
Failure at HomeUr Hwkif »r»4Wa4«. Im

box. Paint was next. White, be­
cause white furniture is sm art and 
because it m atched the woodw ork. 
The flowered chintz in tones o f 
rose .and blue-green with narrow 
frills o f  the plain blue-green tone 
m atched the window curtains.

The dressing table skirt was 
m ade with a one-inch heading 
at the top and tacked along the 
ends o f the table and the hinged

By RUBE GOLD BERG-Vincent Can’t Resist a BedL A L A  P A L O O Z A Failure at home is a failure ev­
erywhere. To leave behind in the 
home, when one goes to one’s 
work in tho morning, unhappy 
hearts or a feeling of relief at 
one's absence is not a promising 
sign of power with souls outside.

7 "o !oN ’!n<NOW-m e  POOR DARLING’S  WAITINGTH A N K S , VINCENT 
YOU C A N  GO IN 
a n d  s e e  PINTO 
FOR A  M INUTH -  
I T  MAY BE FOR 
T H E  L A S T  T IM E

BOO HOO!

WeLL, SIS, I’M \ 
BACK -  I KNEW
you’d Neeo Me,

WITH YOUR 
DISAPPOINTMENT 

IN LOVE AN’ 
YOUR SICK OOG 

AN’ EVERYTHING

VINCENT WOULD 
TAKE IT SO HARD 

I CAN HEAR HIM 
SIGHING -  POOR 
FELLOW’S 

ALL
I BROKEN Jjfc2  IV UP

TO  BE OPERATED ON -  
DON’T  L E T  HER KNOW
HOW S E R I O U S _______
IT  IS ^  --------

arm s with thum btacks through a
double strip o f the plain m aterial.

N OTE Readers who are now 
using Sewing Books No. t, 2 and 3 
will be happy to learn that No. 4 is 
ready for m ailing ; ns well as the 
10-ocnt editions o f No. 1, 2 and 3. 
M rs. Spears has just m ade quilt 
block patterns for three designs

WRL0W M E5T SELLER AT II
selected from  her favorite E arly To the Extreme

Mrs. Hopemore—Would you say, 
that my little Jackie Is really try­
ing?

Teacher—Yes—very.

A m erican quilts. You m ay have 
these patterns F R E E  with your 
order for four books. P rice  o f 
books— 10 cents each postpaid. Set 
o f three quilt block patterns with­
out books— 10 cents. Send orders 
to M rs. Spears, Draw er 10, Bed­
ford Hills, New York.

F r a n k  J a y  U t r l u y

By C . M . P A Y N EIt’s Hard for a Fellah to Figure OutS’M A T T E R  POP

Beware Coughs
from common colds

That Hang On
Crcomuldon relieves promptly be­

cause It goes right to the seat or the 
trouble to loosen germ laden phlegm, 
tncreaso secretion and aid nature to 
soothe and heal raw, tender. Inflam­
ed bronchial mucous membrane*. 
No matter how many medicines yon 
have tried, tell your druggist to sell 
you a bottle o f Crcomulsfon with the 
understanding that you are to like 
the way It quickly allays the cough 
or you are to have ybfirwnoney back.

CREOMULSION
for Cough*,Chest Colds, Bronchitis

f - A m' V o u  s a y  
<5 o o 3 >  M O R N I N 6  

V a  F t £ L  
. < £ o o l>  A n - f jA 'P P V , 
( v W  t H a  'TLi 'R-d s  y  
V A R  & m 6 1 m (, ? J

V W  Y A -  )
A l w a y s  ^ 

K M o w  v j*)a t
V A  A(2E>

, S a v i n ’ /

To relieve
CONSTIPATION

Try this 
Simple, 

Pleasant 
. Way I

Take one or two tablet* of Ex-Lju bofore 
retiring. It taatc* juat like delicious choc­
olate. No upoodK, no bottle*! No fua*. 
no bother! Ex-Lax U ciujr to tuo and 
ploaunt to take! In the morning yon bare 
an eafjr, comfortable bowel.uxivrtncnt. 
Ex-Lax work* gently, without strain or 
discomfort. Except (or the pleaaanl relief 
you enjoy, you acareelr rrilim you hare 
taken a laxative. Available at all drug 
Korea in economical 10V and 25* Loir*.

M ESC AL IK E
Experience and Memory

Experience is the father of Wis­
dom, and Memory the mother.

r  1 S O T  THET BU M P ^ 3  
WMBM l  STUCK; MV HEAD 
AROUKJD TU‘ CORKJER-TO , 

^ . s e e  u m o  u j a s -tlcouW  
S P IC K S  A T M E ' r j T v

r MOW, "tv«5 >
BUMP SHOWS 
CURIOSITY.. >

\  Messrs p a  >.
I J P i r P L E .  M O W S
y  a b o u t  -tryiki- 
I h im  m e x t , _ ,
^ M S i  SALLY r / C O N S T I P A T E D !

6as Crowds Heart.
bloating •••mod to crowd ray heart. AdUrtka 
ilnnhelped right away. Mow 1 eel lean**, beninex, ue, anything I want and atver tett 
bailor."—Mn. Mabu Schott. Two things 
happen when you nr* eonaUpaled. FIRST: 
Accumulated weatte oweU up bowel* nod preae on nerve* In the dixeaUva tract. SEC­
OND: Partly dinted food eterte to decay (ormlax UAS, often brinalng on tour etomaek. 
Iodine lion, and heartburn, bloating you up until you mtrustimea kud for breath* Adlerikm 
wives doublo relief withPDOUUUi ACTION. 
BALANCED Adtotka eontelning threw lese- tivee and lira cuminaUve* relieve* 8TOMACS 
UAS nlmoat at once. It often clean bowel*

Beyond Teaching
Who is too oki to learn is too old  

to teach.

B y J. M IL L A R  W A T TP O P —  Someone's Unlucky
L E A V IN G  T H E  HEN-H OUSE 
D O O R  O P E N ! .—

N O ! ,
T H E V L L  G O  B A C K  H O M E  

T O  R O O S T /

I  C O U L D  M U R D E R  T H A T  
M A N  O E M IN E  -

W O N T  T H E Y  C O M E  
B A C K  H O M E  

Q\ T O  R O O S T
Power of Ink

A drop o f Ink m akes m illions 
think.— Byron.

CALM YOUR N ER V ES !

- W  tired and uinrt, and 
- jm  n k  hid headline, and 

■  hackache aiioclattd
L * , U  with functional dia- 
~  W  turbance*. Alter U k - 

lag D r. Picrcc’a Fa- 
vorite Prvacrlptioe nay

•trength returned, and¥m!a rSeved*o| S* functional dlMurbancca.”  Get ll, la liquid or tableu. at your drug (tore today.

YVjHKtf cold* rnuan entffltng.nneee* 
TV Inn, nrrwnee* e n d  atn m new a In

the nontrlU u*e Mnntholatum. It 
give* quick relief from ttiea* dle- 
oomfort, end promote* healing of 
the Irritated membrane* Ut the 
noetrua. It* vapor* *1*0 reach deep 
Into the atr pmwnge*. bringing 
grateful comfort.

Also rub *ome Mentholatnm on 
your cheat and berk to Improve the 
local blood circulation. Rub It on 
your forehead end temple* to eltay 
headache and neuralgia due to odd*.

The BeU Syndicate. la t .-V fW ) lervlca
There Are Bonds

He that sips often at last drink*
it up.Cheerful NewsBy GLUYAS WILLIAMSS T E P L A D D E R

“ Did you po»t my letter, Mary?”  
asked her mistress.

“ Yis. mum. indeed 1 did."
"But why hnvo you brought the 

pennies I gave you for tho stamps?"
“ Sure. I didn’ t have to use one. 

mum." replied Mary. "I  shllpped 
th* letter In the box when nobody 
was lukln’ ."

flieUWlD DRIVERS
get jail sentences IMIUPEDWNU— L

An advertisement says: “ Cat 
your tailor bill in h a lf/’ What’ s 
the use. He’d send another.

What's la a Name!
Here Is a list of towns with odd 

names, which, with the state in­
cluded, make Interesting combina­
tions: Ash. Kan.; Carpet. Tex.:
Ogoo. Oa.; Odcar, Me.; Skeleton. 
Ky.; Shoo. Fla.; Kay, O.; Houdy, 
Miss.: Fiven. Tenn. -  Wall SL 
Journal.

im * swoimesrfMWK 
dc«  jo d  s * f n i» r  war

ton ooi n w o  *  wxt* n - 
fan wMKMt om jm iw n

WHEN kidneys function badly *nd' 
you suffer a nagging backache, 

with dirtiness, burning, scanty or looi 
frequent urination ana gelling up at 
night; when you feel tired, nervous,) 
a lf upset. . .  use Doan's Pills.

Doan's are especially for poorly’ 
working kidneys. Millions of boxes 
are used every year. They sre recons-i 
mended the country over. Ask y ow  
neighbor!

GEAN'MA JONES 
97, WISHES &EP
SftEA0 SH6S»ET
EP4>umNG2i
veaes a to

CAE PEMOUSH 
AT CAiLEOAD 

CROSSING
iuhatU vebv-
P00Y IN SOOi 
AFKbHUEEV 
ABOUT?

CAUSE Of FATAL 
CRASH

Comparison
Spectator—! simply can't under­

stand why anyone should miss a 
putt as short as that 

Golfer—Let me remind you that 
the hole la only four and a quarter 
Inches across and there Is tho whole 
world outside i t

Good Merchmdise
G» B. CONSISTENTLYan »*r» wit* xKf shxarti >* 

atxwp. H ir f t o Y f ,  I I W K 6 K0 
owMb s«*R nrtrtirt enwts

tttvn  u  wtKf 
SftH fb m h  m  iweflaW «*

tisuHs «  noKorj

.

C L A S S I F I E D
D E P A R T M E N T

T h * O r ig in a l  
C h o c o lo » o d  l o K a f i v *

ink tkem togetner
in  tfo u -l

M iserable
with backache?

D o a n s  P i l l s

SPEEPtR-

WJJDClSrreiP AFTER 
P£ATH £F CVCUST
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C hild  W ou ld  L ove I Bruckarts Wathington Digest 
These D utch  D olls Home Folks Fed Up on W ar Talk; 

W ant to Know About Tax Problem i

Considerable Transition From Interest in European, 
Affairs to Domestic Concerns on Part of Public I

Noted; Treasury to Borrow More Money.

B y  W IL L IA M  B R U C K A R T
WNU Service, National Press Bldg., Washington, D. C.

I H o u s e h o M N e i u s 1
I . / /  ■ i M l  style tor curd |a I W-T'J-—'—̂ 7 V  /  1 *050 '  ..

j WASHINGTON.—Observers, here 
In Washington, hove a little woy of 
their own by which they arc able 

l to forecast the trend of public 
j thought and interest. It Is n meth- 
i od that was developed solely from 
! experience. Most of us who attempt 
| to serve you, outside of Washing- 
| ton, ns eyes nnd cars have learned 
| to watch the demand for speakers 
: and subjects upon which public men 
I arc asked to talk. It is not an in­
fallible method, but it is usually cor­
rect. The only fly in the ointment 
is that we must learn to distinguish 
between the propaganda preachers 
and the legitimate desires of groups 
to havo government questions ex­
plained to them.

It is to be noted here, by way of 
review, thnt three months ago the 
bulk of the speeches by men from 
Washington had to do with war. our 
chances of getting involved, neu­
trality, etc. There were inter­
spersed with these, of course, the 
usual truckloads of gut! from Secre­
tary Wallace nnd the other self-

Pattcrn 6175

Dolls a rc always fun to sew.
When they work up as quickly as 
these (they ’ re two pieces with n 
bond to round the head) you ’ ll 
want to keep on m aking them.
Pattern 6475 contains n pattern 
nnd directions for m aking the 
dolls nnd their clothes; m aterials 
needed.

T o obtain this pattern send 15 
cents in coins to The Sewing Cir­
cle , Household Arts Dept., 249 W.
14th S t„  New York. N. Y .

P lease w rite your nam e, ad- j appointed spokesmen for agricul 
dress and pattern num ber plainly. | turc, rinds nnd cracklings from Sec-

! rotary Ickes. nnd about the usual 
! quantity of mouthings from the "su- 
| perior minds" whose owners arc 
; greatly concerned in development 
I of culture, liberal thinking. Hut it 
! was about the war nnd related sub- 
( jeets that most people wanted to 
! know.

PE A C E  I Thc *ccne ** changing now; in-
* , , I deed, n considerable transition nl-

J f i P  PV".r#n,ee1of »*7C? U 1 ready has taken place. Home folks
• 0,,T n 7 *  i Retting ted up. at last, and arcpeace. Without a knowledge of I ho I d , o{ knowinB m„ rc about 

farts we cannot have such a public . . . . . . .  „ „ „
opinion. Give light and the people will , home problems and what the gov- 
find their own way.” - U .  S. Senator eminent Intends to do about them. 
Henry C. Lodge Jr. | It is a trend most pleasant to con-

----------------------------  | template. There simply can be no
Dr. Pierce’s Pleasant Pellets are an doubt about thc fact that If thc peo- 
e f fe c t iv e  laxative. Sugar coated, i pie of the United States forget about
Children like them. Buy no\w!— Adv,

Alone in P overty 
W hilst you a rc prosperous, you 

ca n  num ber m any friends, but 
when the storm  com es, you are 
le ft a lone.—Ovid.

- M t f i e f f i g g e r o n  
Constipation, and 

Pepsiinze Acid Stomach Too
When constipation brings on acid indi­

gestion, bloating, dizzy spells, gas. coated 
tongue, sour taste, and bad breath, your 
stomach is probably loaded up with cer­
tain undigested food and your bowels don't
move. So you need bot 
break up fast that rich u

Pepsin to help 
undigested food in

thnt war in Europe nnd pay ntten 
tlon to their own business, we will 
be able to stay out rather easily.
Comes an Awakening to 
The Problem of Taxation

With this background, then, let 
me call attention to the number of 
.persons, who. appear at long last to 
have awakened to the problem of 
taxntlon—federal, state, county and 
city. Obviously, when there is an 
Interest in taxation there Is a paral­
lel interest In what government docs 
with the money taken from Its citi 
zens. This Interest surely exists 
now to a grenter extent than at any 
time within recent months. More 
nnd moro inquiries are being re­
ceived, more and more requests

your stomach. and Laxative Senna to puil [for discussion of thc subject arc 
the trigger on those lazy bowels. So be
sure your laxative also contains Pepsin. 
Take Dr. Caldwell's Laxative, because its 
Syrup Pepsin helps you gain that won­
derful stomach-relief, while thc Laxative 
Senna moves your bowels. Tests prove the 
power of Pepsin to dissolve those lumps of 
undigested protein food which may linger 
in your stomach, to cause belching, gastric 
acidity and nausea. This is how pepsin- 
izing your stomach helps relieve it of such 
distress. At the same time this medicine 
wakes up lazy nerves and muscles in your 
bowels to relieve your constipation. So see 
how much better you feel by taking the 
laxative that also puts Pepsin to work on 
that stomach discomfort, too. Even fin­
icky children love to taste this pleasant 
family laxative. Buy Dr. Caldwell’s Lax­
ative-Senna with Syrup Pepsin at your 
druggist today I

L ife 's  Thirst
L ife 's  thirst quenches itself |_______  ____

With draughts which double thirst. j meet expenses, nnd naturally the

reaching officials in Washington 
| And If my Information from outside 
| sources be correct, there is a slml 
i lnr interest being shown In thc 
I states and cities.
| In this period of changing Inter- 
j est, Secretary Morgcnthau an' 
nounccd that the United States 

| treasury is prepared to borrow 
more money. In the next two 

! months, according to thc Secretary.
■ tho treasury will borrow on addl- 
! tional half a billion dollars. It will 
| refund something like a billion and 
i n quarter, also, but that process is j simply trading new bonds or notes 
I for old ones thnt fall due. The bor­

rowing Is "new”  money. In the sense 
that new bonds will be sold and the 
proceeds used by the treasury to

m i m

—Anon.

DRUGGISTS
Exclusive agencies available for 
fast-selling, nationally known and 
advertised arthritis trealmcnL 
Protected price. Write for deal. 
American Ru-Mari Company,6022 
Wilshirc Los Angeles, Calif.

rruA JA y y

LIQUID - TABLETS /
SALVE-NOSE DROPS

Bureau o f Standards
A  BUSINESS organ isation  

which wants to  get the 
most for the money sets up 
standards by w h ich  to  Judge 
what i> offered to it. Just as in 
W ashington the governm ent 
maintains a Bureau o f  Standards. 
•  You can have your own Burean 
o f  Standards, too. Just consult 
the advertising columns o f  your 
oew spaper. They safeguard 
your purchasing power every 
day o f  every year.

national debt will be Increased by 
' that amount. It Is well to remem­
ber that, ns of November 1, the 

! public debt was $41,139,071,217, and 
' that there arc several other billions 
! of bonds issued by such agencies 
j as the Reconstruction Finance cor- 
! poratlon. the Home Owners Loan 
I corporation and debts guaranteed 
[ by agencies like thc Federal Hous­

ing administration, for which the 
treasury Is morally, If not actually, 
responsible.

It Is not curious, therefore, thnt 
folks are asking each other: where 
is this spending going to stop? or, 
how are we going to pay off thnt 
debt? or, what arc our taxes going 
to be In the future?
Tax Receipts for Nation 
Astounding in Magnitude

I am indebted to the federation 
of lax administration for some to­
tals of tax receipts for tho nation 
thnt are not only astounding In their 
magnitude but startling In thc Im­
plications they give.

The statistics disclose thnt the 
American people paid $14,811,000,000 
In taxes in 1938. This money was 
collected by the federal, state, coun­
ty and city governments and some 
odds and ends of special taxing 
districts which levied taxes for es­
pecial purposes. Of this amount, 
the federal government collected 
$8,034,000,000; state governments 
collected $3,857,000,000, and local 
government! took a toll of $4,920,- 
000,000.

One of the new taxes—the tax on 
payrolls to maintain pensions and 
unemployment—yielded In excess of 
$1 ,500,000,000, or almost one-tenth of 
all of the money taken by the tax 
collector. Its total seems to give

substance to the complaint thnt this 
tax is a tremendous burden on any 
one who hires workers. The pay^ 
roll tax, according to thc ndmlnis' 
trators’ analysis, was thc third larg­
est of single items of taxation—only, 
the property tnx nnd thc Income to* 
brought in more money for the 
spenders of federal, state or local 
governments.

Property taxes, levies on every­
thing you own, your house or farm 
or horses or automobile, paid a to­
tal tributo of $4,745,000,000. If you 
are good at flgurcs you will And that 
sum to be 32 per cent—almost one-> 
third—of all of the taxes paid by 
the United States last year.

Income taxes ranked second In 
thc sums produced for government­
al use. The income taxes laid by
federal, state nnd city governments, . . .
supplied $3,242,000,000, and that is Cooking the Thanksgiving
22 per cent of thc revenue.

AnofAer Group Includes 
The Concealed Levies

Out there is another group of 
taxes—a long list of items that In­
clude most of the sneak-thief taxes, 
unseen and concealed levies—that j 
really is bearing down. These gen -, 
cral and special sales taxes, federal( 
stamp levies, excise and license, 
taxes were responsible for slightly , t0 guggcit t0 you 
morc than onc-fourth^of all ™ n ey  , that enjoyment of 

. —  family

1849
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w

i s M :

MEMORIES OF TUANKSGIV1NO PRICELESS HEIRLOOMS

Dinner

Incredible as it may seem the cal­
endar is bringing Thanksgiving time 
again and with It comes to every 
homemaker thoughts for thc Thanks­
giving menu—plans for its prepara­
tion and anticipation of thc family's 
return.

Today, however, I want to re­
verse this whole situation. 1 want

i Thanksgiving day 
, should be thc key- 
i note of every one 
i of thc plans that 
you make for thc 
day. Now that 
does not mean for

M 4

paid Into treasuries of government 
This money come from tobacco, 
liquor, gasoline, sales taxes of vari­
ous kinds which you saw only by 
close examination or could not dis­
cover at nil, licenses, etc. The 
gasoline tax was the largest rev­
enue producer. Federal, state nnd 
local governments obtained $981.- j  onc minute that 1 
000,000 because most of us burned : „ m suggesting 
up gasoline through use of the motor • that thc Thanksgiving dinner be 
cars. Liquor revenue amounted to .lighted. 1 couldn’ t do that, for who 
$838,000,000. It is said by some 0( u.  f0r onc minute would sacri- 
authoritics that this type of tax has. flee those precious memories of 
about reached its peak. To increase j Thanksgiving dinners at grandmoth- 
it more will mean that bootleggers , cr,  that are really priceless heir- 
can begin to operate once more, be-! looms. No, I say—we won’ t sacrifice 
cause added taxes wlU send the | the dinner—but wc will plan It so 
price of liquor to a point where boot-1 thnt you will be as free as possible 
legging becomes profitable. Such Is 0n rhonksgivlng day so that you too 
not the case with the other taxes In can cnj0y the fomlly and let thc 
the group; you pay them and like I t .; family enjoy you. A miracle you 

All In all. the administrators’ j say? No—not really—Just wise plan- 
analysis shows ten general group- j ning—plenty of work thc day before 
lngs of taxes throughout the nation, perhaps—but time—no worry—nnd 
and It is interesting to note that i an easy dinner on Thanksgiving- 
each of these ten major Items i s 1 and that's worth while Isn't it? 
used by more than one level of gov- j How to do It? Well hero are my 
emment. That Is to say, the fe d - ' suggestions. First, it ts entirely pos- 
eral and state governments will be ! sible to clean, prepare and even 
found using income taxes; states stuff the turkey the day before 
and counties and cities will be found ; Thanksgiving rather than on 
using some types of sales taxes, , Thanksgiving morning. Then put it 
along with a similar tax by the on a rack In an open roasting pan 
national government, and some of and store it in your refrigerator 
the other taxes may be found c m .; over night. It you have a mechanl- 
ployed as revenue producers by two ; cal refrigerator it will be running of 
or all three of thc levels of govern-; course. If you have an Ice refrig- 
menu j erator, be sure to get an ample sup-

Which brings us to a recentI ply of Ice so that your refrigerator 
speech made by John W, Hanes, j  can really work for you over this 
under-secretary of the treasury. M r .; holiday.
Hanes arrived at a conclusion that Vegetables—salads—relishes. In-
only a general increase In business eluding celery, radish roses, etc..
would provide enough income for all 
of tho tax caters. He suggested that 
there wero few, if any, untapped 
sources of income. Insofar as the 
federal government is concerned. 
And other students have talked 
frankly about the similarity of tax 
problems among the federal, state 
and local governments.

Cut in Personal Exemptions 
Would Add Only 60 Millions

The school of thought that has ad­
vocated broadening the base of In­
com e taxes by the federal govern­
ment, by reducing the personal ex­
emptions from $2,500 for married 
couples and $1,000 for single per­
sons, was *hown by Mr. Hanes tc 
be somewhat ignorant of facts. He 
pointed out that an exemption of 
$2,000 for married couples and $800 
for single persons, Instead of th«i 
present limits, would add only 
$60,000,000 a year to the notional 
revenue. That Is not a good drop; 
In the bucket If all of the present1 
income tax amendments that havs 
been mentioned were now In force, | 
the total taxes they would yield 
would be only about $250,000,000,; 
according to Mr. Hanes. Hence. Mr. 
Hanes said, with reference to tho! 
federal government:

"You. the American public, have 
the final control. Demands from j 
‘back home’ upon the Congress for j 
more and more federal expendi­
tures, for less and less needed proj­
ects, are at least a partial source of 
difficulties.

even desserts, one 
and all can be 
gotten ready on 
Wednesday and 
ns 1 say, then all 
thnt remains for 
Thnnksglving day 
is Just the cook­
ing, thc table set­
ting and later the 

serving of the vlnnds.
Below I am including a number 

of Thanksgiving recipes which are 
all planned for Just such Thanks­
giving ease. And—a happy Thanks­
giving to each one of you.

Roast Turkey.
Allow 44 to 1 pound of turkey per 

person served. Dress, clean, stuff 
and truss turkey. Brush well with 
unsalted fat and place on rack in 
large open roasting pan. tStore over 
night In refrigerator tf desired).

Roast in moderate oven (325 de­
grees) allowing approximately 20 
minutes per pound roasting time 
(or a 12-pound turkey. 17 minutes 
per pound for an 18-pound turkey 
and 15 minutes per pound for a 22- 
pound turkey.

Brush with melted butter Just be­
fore serving.

Dressing for Turkey.
10 cups soft bread crumbs
1 cup butter (melted)
1 tablespoon salt
1 cup chopped parsley
2 tablespoons poultry seasoning
Mix all ingredients thoroughly and

use for stuffing the turkey. Note:

! I F  YOU want a bright new every 
i * day dress that’s tailored and 
• practical, yet sufficiently youthful; 

small pieces), heat well, and s e r v e  and gay so that you ’ ll never tire 
hot. ,° f  it even after constant wear,

a  . .  , _  . , ___ make it like No. 1850. It buttonsOranged Sweet Potatoes. down lhe front, coat stylef is durt_
(Serves 6-8) fitted at the waistline, and

Parboil 6 medium sweet potatoes, trilnmed with contrast. If this is 
peel and slice lengthwise. (Prepare your flrst atlcm pt at hom e drcss. 
to this point on Wednesday and store rnnking i jt’s a sim ple pattern thnt 
overnight in refrigerator.) Arrange g0es very quickly and easily. It’s 
slices in baking dish nnd sprinkle especially pretty in plaid wool, 
with tt cup brown sugar, dot with 2 v c|velcen or chnllis. 
tablespoon, butter and add 1 table- gm art and Youthful<
spoon grated orange rind. Pour over F or large wom en, No. 1849 has

L e a r  S.CndtCi  beautiful)? slenderising lines, and 2 tablespoons brown sugar and a . exDer»iv designed to give thc
ered fPo°rP30k m?nu tes moderately r ° und-bosom cd, slender-hipped ef-

fcct  that maturC flKurcs look best hot oven (375 dcgrcci). Unco er d st youthful in. A good 
nnd bake approximately 15 minutes J
longer.
Creamrd Onions With Cream Cheese.

(Serves 6)
2 pounds small white onions
3 tablespoons butter 
3 tablespoons flour 
2 cups milk 
Mi teaspoon salt
1 block cream cheese i jh e  captain of onc New York-

w S .  " S I ’S  S T d S J T J t t !  m aster0 o ? 't h e
day before Thanksgiving and In this Q 1 J Ma £ c  colored m a n n e r  

on T^rsdVv “  H arlem  dance hall is paid 
Melt butter, add flour and stir thor-
oughly. Add milk and aalt and aUr m o01! ?
until thick. Then add 1 block of ceived m^ore mon^y _as_thc p r o ­

Strange Facts

I
•

John r». Positions 
Now ‘Antiques’
Taps for Evil Spirits

t
•

style for curd parties and lunch­
eons because all the detailing ia 
on the bodice. The neckline is 
particularly flattering."'ThiB dress 
m akes up sm artly in velvet, faills 
or thin wqoJ.

The Patterns.
No. 1850 is designed for sizes 

12, 14, 16, 18, 20 and 40. Size 14 
requires 4 Mi yards o f 30-inch m a­
terial with long sleeves; 4% yards 
with short; % yard contrast.

No. 1849 is designed for sizes 
36, 38, 40, 42, 44, 46, 48, 50 and 52. 
Size 38 requires 4% yards o f 39- 
inch m aterial with long sleeves; 
4% yards with three-quarter 
s leeves; % yard ribbon.

Pall Pattern Book.
Special extra ! Send -today fo r  

your new Fall Pattern Book with 
a stunning selection of a hundred 
perfect patterns for all shapes and 
sizes. Save m oney and know the 
keen satisfaction o f personally 
planned, perfectly fitted garm ents 
by m aking your own frock s with 
these sm art, carefully cu t designs. 
You can ’ t go wrong—every  pat­
tern includes a step-by-step sew  
chart to guide beginners. P ries  
of Pattern .Book, 45 cents.

‘Send you r order to The Sewing 
Circle Puttern Dept., R oom  1324, 
211 W. W nckcr D r., Chicago, I1L 
P rice  o f patterns, 15 cents (in 
coins) each.

i Dell Syndicate— W N U Service.)

OLD FOLKS
Hera Is t a n k s  M M  st 

Conditions On# to Stagstah » — Ms
I f  yuu think sB IsxsUm s  
urt alike. Ju.t try this 

_  all M te ta b le  U w t lM .
_______ _ r'-frr«Mng. InvisontUog. Dr-
pend able relief from tick  hnuloelaas. Ulkma «aBw  
tired feeling when unrelated with cou tlpa lk ia . 
U » .<  - --a rw . L  g r t a Z S c b o x e f  N K fra m y o sr  Ifltn o n  KtSC draksfat. Make the teat— then 
If not delighted, return the bos to  ua. We wIB 
refund the purrhoae ^  
p r i c e .  T h s t 'a  f a i r ,  d t f f------------ i aGet N R  Tablet* today.

cream cheese broken in small dent o f  a local m usicians’ union 
in 1938 than Mr. R oosevelt re-

klc with buttered cracker crumbs States.

For a number of years, at least 
I three-quarters o f all "an tiques" 
(im ported into this country have 
, been fakes.

Because it handles only large 
accounts, thc First National bank 

■ o f New York city has fewer do- 
. positors than stockholders.

_______  ( This amount of dresting Is sufficient
We have developed our country, for a 10-pound turkey. If a larger 

a $10,000,000,000 appetite with a turkey Is t obe stuffed the recipe 
$5,000,000,000 pockctbook. I think, should be Increased proportionately, 
our problem Is not ap much when Glblel Gravy,
wo balance our budget, as where p our olf |lquid m pan In which 
In other words, how much federal turkey has been roasted. From liq-
expenditure are you going to de 
mand and how do you propose that 
the government raise the funds?"

I am hoping that the apparent 
trend toward a public consciousness 
of the government's financial condi­
tion—whether that government be 
national or state or local—will ex­
pand and begin to roll like mountain 
flood water*.

uld skim off 8 tablespoons fat; re­
turn fat to roasting pan and brown 
with 8 tablespoons flour. Add 3 cups 
stock In which giblets, neck, and 
tip of wings have been cooked; or 
If preferred, 3 cups milk may be 
substituted Instead of the stock. 
Cook, stirring constantly, until 
thick: then season to taste with salt 
and pepper. Add giblets (cut In

and bake in a moderate oven <350 
degrees) until crackers are
browned. Serve at once.
Cabbage-Flnrapplc Gelatin Salad.

1 tablespoon unflavored Gelatin 
V4 cup pineapple Juice (canned)
1 cup water (boiling)
IV« teaspoon salt
1 Vi tablespoons vinegar
2 cups cabbage (shredded) mrfShr**-*
1 cup pineapple (diced) i The three volleys fired into thc
Soak gelatin In the cold pineapple njr at m ilitary funerals were orlgi- 

Julce. Add to hot water and stir nally intended to frighten away 
until dissolved. Add salt and vine- pyil spirits and, therefore, prevent 
gar. ChlU. Add remaining ingredi- them from  entering the m ourners' 
ents and pour into mold. ChlU un- hearts, which stood a jar at the 
tU set. I burial o f  a com rade.—C ollier’s.

Pumpkin Pie. '
(Makes 2 pies)

3 cups pumpkin
4 eggs
lVi cups brown sugar 
V« teaspoon salt 
\k teaspoon grated nutmeg 
% teaspoon ginger 
H teaspoon cloves 
Mi teaapoon allspice 
Vt teaspoon cinnamon 
444 cups milk (scalded)

To cold canned or cooked pump- j 
kin add thc eggs tsllghtly beaten). I 

Blend salt and i 
spices with the1 
brown sugar. Mix ! 
pumpkin mixture 
with thc brown i 
sugar mixture. | 
and to this add i 
thc scalded milk. (

Pour Into pie plate lined with pastry ( 
dough Bake 10 minutes in a hot j 
oven (450 degrees), or until crust I 
is set. Then reduce heat to a mod­
erate oven (350 degrees), and bake j 
until filling is Arm—about 45 min- i 
utes. (These too can be baked on the ; 
day prccccding Thanksgiving.) |

Natural Wisdom
The unselfish heart knows as 

much as a book on etiquette can 
teach.

THAHKSGMN6

Still Schoolboys
Nations arc but enlarged school­

boys.—Froude.

CLOTHESPIN 
NOSE
G a t •  cold? G et fw o-w ay re lie f 
w ith  L u d ea 'tl A  L w h s 'i  on 
yo u r tuncue h e lp , soothe thront 
- I h m ,  ae it rnelU, re le a r n  to ol 
m enthol vapor. Your breath 
Carrie* th i, to  d o w e d  naaal 
p a ae ag ee , h e lp *  o p e n  y o u r  
"d o th etp io  note!”

LUDEN’S 5*
Menthol Cough Drops

CAMELS 
BURN SO MUCH 
LONGER-GIVE 

EXTRA SMOKING. 
THEY'RE THE BEST 

CIGARETTE BUY.'

Whatever price you pay per peek, 
■ it’ s Important to remember this 
faotl By burning 25JB tlower than 
the average o f (lie 15 other o f  the 
largeat-aelling brand* tested— 
•lower than any o f them—CAMELS 
give a smoking pint equal to

Don’ t Mlsa Three Household Hint*.
"Household Hlnla" by Eleanor 

llowc contains as helpful a group of 
time-saving suggestions on every 
phase of housekeeping as one can 
ever expect to find. To secure a 
ropy—to be able to put these Ideas 
to work in your own home—send 10 
cents in coin to "Household Hints,”  
care of Eleanor Howe, 919 North 
Michigan Avenue, Chicago, Illinois.

Homemade Bread for Young 
And for Old.

All thc world love* homemade 
breed and what la more home­
like than thc old-fashioned hot 
butterscotch rolls, homemade 
bread, parker house rolls, etc., 
that mother used to make? It’s 
Just those kind of recipe* (simpli­
fied though), that you will find in 
this column next week. Be sure 
to look for them.

lK e l« * s e d  b y  W i s u r o  N e w s p a p e r  U nion.)

WILBUR 8HAW—Automobile 
facing ctiempl on—winner ol Indian- 
•pell* Sou-mile race IU7, UR

MORE PLEASURE 
PER PUFF-MORE 
PUFFS PER PACK

EXTRA 
SMOKES 

PER 
PACK

ftunyftr PMay 
If—r Btif flfctfitti

smmmsmmmmmmmmm—mmmm
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The Southwestern Bell Telephone Company 
serves some 275 Texas cities—from the smallest 
to the largest. In Littlevillc, Mediumvillc, Bigvill* 
our job  is the same— to furnish fast, accurate, 
dependable telephone service, at a price that is 
reasonable to you.

®  SOUTHWESTERN BELL TELEPHONE CO.

Lorf Dbtanc* li M i l  bMt to being there hi penon.

J lou can probably agree th at 
throe aro certainly conservative 
figures . .  .
— 4 or 5 months of nasty weather 

right ahead o f you now
— 8 or 10 daily cold starts for  your 

car
— C to 8 minutes per start, till your 

engine’s near-warm
A nd y e t  even that can run up  
your engine ’s cold-w eather "s ta rt­
ing-stretch”  to  right around 90 
hours! . . .T h e  fou lest 90 hours 
that G nngster W inter could  fire 
at y ou r en g in e—y ou r  battory . 
A nd d on ’ t ever hope to halt him 
w ith m otor  oils w hose biggest 
brag is " fa s t  flow .”  T h a t 's  not 
enou gh—and it ’s n ot your m oney ’s 
w o r th , c o n s id e r in g  th a t  " f a s t  
flow ”  is m ighty Blow W inter lubri­

cation  com pared  to OIL-PLATING.
O i l -p l a t i n g  in y ou r  engine 

will lubricate before any oil can 
circulate. T h a t ’s because tho m in­
ute you  start up  w ith  patented 
C on oco  G erm  P rocessed oil it 
m akes OIL-PLATING "m a g n etize ”  
to  all inner engine surfaces, so 
that it cann ot drain dow n again. 
It can n ot retire to the crankcase 
ub y ou  park tho car. L ike any 
other good  plating, OIL-PLATING 
stays right where it ’s plated by 
Germ  Process act ion — all over the 
w orking parts. T h e y ’ ve " g o t  o n ”  
their OIL-PLATING all tho while 
y ou ’ re indoors. T h ey  never "tak o  
o f f ”  their OIL-PLATING. W hen 
you  com e  ou t to  start then, your 
OIL-PLATING can ’ t be delayed 
oven 90 soconds— or one-ninth o f

a second ! A nd aw ay y ou  go. 
battery  hardly know s it was w ork­
ing. A nd  it ’s a good  long w hile 
liefore tho gauge-stick calls fo r  
on added quurt o f ’ G orm  P roc­
essed oil. Y our M ileage Mercia] 
has y o u r  r ig h t  W in te r  grnf 
C hange today  — to  that Cone 
station o f  his. C ontinental 
C om pan y

CONOCO GERM PROCESSED OIL
from Your Mileage Merchant

• . m

" ! ‘ "fcntr

Heinrich Bros. Service Station
235 NORTH 9th PHONEvdfiS

’A
*V i ritiot '  - j .

SLATON, TEXAS i

ROOM FOR RENT: 510 W. Lynn, j 
On pavement. |

POSITIVELY no huntinir on L7 
Ranch holdings.’W. W. Branson. 2p j

FOR SALE: 115 acre farm all In ! 
cultivation, good improvements 
5 miles south of Slaton. Also 197 ; 
acre farm, 195 acres in cultivation, 
good improvements, 1 V» miles ! 
north of Posey. Possession Jan. 1, j 
1940. See or write Jotev'PteSchriev- J 
er, San Angelo, Texas or see Wal- 1 
ter Jocketx, Slaton. 4tp-16

FOR RENT: Good modern fl-room 
stucco house. Inquire nt 145 Texas 
Ave. ltc

FOR RENT: Furnished Apartment, 
640 So. 10th St. ltp

LOST: Black and white spotted 
Boston Terrier. Answers to name 
“ Rlackie.”  Reward. E. R. Legg ltc

FOR SALE: 1937 Ford 60 Coupe. 
New Rings, wnter pump. Only 21,- 
■ uui ,i !J-.’ ...■ii.-'j.m."

WHY suffer from Colds?

For quick 
relief from , 
cold symptoms 
take 666 
Liquid-Tablet s-!Sa I ve-N ose  D rops

666

Tale o f Two
Texas C ities

A N D  TIIE IR  TE LEPH O N E  SYSTEMS

Alcorn Transfer

The Slaton Slatonite
■LATON1TB PUBLISHING CO. 
Baton, Lubbock County, Texas

i i t o a  Times Purchased January
20, 1927

Altered as second, flasa mail mat­
ter at the postoffice at Slaton, Tex. 
JL If. RANKIN. Editor • Publiaher

ADVERTISING RATES 
K SPLAY ADVERTISING — 35c 

per column inch to all agencies, 
with usual discount 

BOCAL READERS—set in 8-pt. 
JPc per line of Five Words, Net. 
To Agoneivs, jQc pur line, with 
usual discount 

BARDS OF THANKS — 50c. 
RESOLUTIONS, ■ Memoirs, or 

Obituaries, (excepting accounts 
af deaths, news originating in 
this office), 5 cents per line. 
Poetry, 10c per line.

CHURCH OF CHRIST.
Services each week as follows:
Sunday: Bible Study at 9:45 

a. m.
Preaching and Communion at 11 

a. m.
Young People’s Training class 

at 6:30 p. m.
Preaching at 7:30 p. m.
Prayer Meeting Wednesday, 7:30
You are alwuys welcome.

EARNEST McCOY, Pastor.

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC 
Any erroneous reflection upon the 
reputation or standing of any Indi­
vidual, firm or corporation, that 
may appear in tho columns of The 
Slatonite will be gladly corrected 
when called to our attention.

BUBSCRIPTIONS IN ADVANCE 
Rubbock, Lynn, Garza Co.s _ $1.50
Butside these counties______ $2.00
Ruyond 6th Postal Z on e ------$2.25
te changing your address, please 
give us your OLD as well as your 
HEW address.

FOR SALE: Ezy-Way electric
washing machine. Almost new, 
$25.00. Dr. C. H. Mcllroy.

FOR RENT: Beedroom. Kitchen 
privileges 755 So. 11th

ESTRAYED: a 2-year old Red 
Roan Bull at L7 Ranch, Slaton

SALE: Baby Beef type Stock 
Turkey; also Thanksgiving and 
Christmas Turkeys. Mrs. E. E. Wil­
son. 2tp

CHRISTIAN CHURCH.
Sunday School 9:15 a. m. 
Christian Endeavor, 7 p. m. 
Preaching Service on first Sun­

days of each month.
Morning service, 11:00 o’clock. 
Evening service, 7:45.

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH. 
Sunday, November ID. 1939 
Sunday School, 9:45 a. m.
Sunday Sermon at 11 a. m. 
Theme: “The Family of God.” 
Pioneer Intermediate Study 

Group, 6:00 p. hi.
Guest speaker, Mrs. Stevens, 

“ Mary Slessor o f Calabar.”  
Evening Service: 7:00 p. m. 
Evening Sermon Theme: “ Neith­

er Old Fashioned nor New Fash­
ioned.”

The evening service hour is 
changed to 7:00 p. m. beginning 
this Sunday.

Welcome to all to come and wor­
ship with us.

J. PAUL STEVENS, Pastor.

BAPTIST CHURCH.
Sunday School, 9:45 a. m. 
Church Services, 11 a. in.
B. T. U., 6:30 p. m.
Evening Service at 7:30 p. m. 
REV. W. F. FERGUSON, Pastor.

METHODIST "CHURCH.
J. O. Quattlebaum, jr., Pastor. 
Sunday Services:
Sunday School. 9:45 a. m.
Young People's League nt 6:30.

Morning aervicea; 8 a.m.; 9:30 a.

“ Welcome."

CIRCLES
The Blanche Simpson Circle of 

the First Baptist Church will havo 
their regular meeting Monday aft­
ernoon at 3 o’clock in the home 
of Mrs. Armca on West Garza St. 
Mrs. A. C. Strickland will teach on 
the book “ Eugene Salce.”  All mem 
bers are urged to attend.

•
The B. L. Lockett Missionary 

Circle of the First Baptist Church 
will be next Monday nt 3 o’clock 
in the home of Mrs. E. M. Lott, 
520 West Lubbock Street.

•
The Lottie Moon Qircle of the 

First Baptist Church will have their 
next meeting in the home of Mrs. 
Joe Teague. The meeting will start 
nt 3 o’clock, and all members arc 
invited to attend.

Have your prescriptions filled ai 
TEAGUE DRUG STORE by a 

Registered Pharmacist

CARD OF THANKS
We wish lo  express our sincere 

appreciation for tho consoling ex­
pressions o f  sympathy, the thought 
ful services o f  friends, and the 
beautiful spiritual and floral o f ­
ferings received during the illness 
and death o f our w ife and mother.

Herman Vcrkamp and family

Louie Welch, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. G. E. Welch has been elected 
president of the Los Alegrcs, Abi­
lene Christian college’s Spanish 
student organization.

, Mrs. E. M. Lott 
Hostess To Baptist 
Home Makers Class

The Home Makers Class of the 
First Baptist Church had their 
bueinesa and aocial meeting of tho 
month at the homo of Mrs. E. M. 
Lott, 520 West Lubbock Street, 
Thursday afternoon at 3 o'clock, 

Mrs, Stottlcmlre presided over 
tho business meeting. Plans were 
discussed for the Christmas party, 
and the following committees were 
appointed: Refreshment, Mcsdnmcs 
Scott, Lott and Joe Teague; Social, 
Mcsdnmcs Bevis Hannah nnd Cul­
ver; and Decorations, Guy Brown, 
Jeffconts, and Bickcrstnff.

After the business meeting, Mrs. 
Hannah and Mrs. Culver took 
charge of the games. A salad pinto 
with orange chrysanthemums ns 
plnte favors were served to the fol- 
lowing members, Mesdnmes Speight 
Ferguson. Culver, Hollis, Tongue, 
Hannah. Jeffcoats, Stotts, Stallings 
Rust, Armes, Martin, Brown; two 
visitors Mrs. W. A, Baton, Welling­
ton, Kansas, and Mrs. L. B. Hngcr- 
mnn, nnd the hostess, Mrs. Lott.

Mrs. J. W. Hyatt nnd daughter, 
Judith, o f Lubbock spent last 
weekend visiting in the homo of 
Mr, nnd Mrs. W. R. Wilson.

Mr. nnd Mrs. W. E. Chandler of 
Greenville arrived this week nnd 
are visiting their son, Woodic 
Chandler.

ST JOSEPH’S CHURCH 
Rev. T. D. O’Brien, Pastor

000 miles. A Bargain. See Howard 
Hoffman, ltp

CO
Due to Colds

Bronchial Irritations
This formula U tm m rnttly ruprrior— 

trrfiw njouily In m ira ivv o f  more 
ordinary rtmrJut. aayt Doctor 

Pour yourMlI "* tMtpoon of Buckley'* 
C A N A D IO L Mlntur*—  tel It tie on your 
tonrue ■ mom 
Feel ilt quick
tonrue ■ moment then twtllow llowly. 
Feel it* quick powerful pungent action 
ipread through throat, head and bronchial

ttarti to I omen thick, choking phlegm 
and open up clogged bronchial tuba* 
Over 10 million bottle* told in cold wintry 
Canad*. A  tingle tip will tall you why. 
Contain* no sugar to can be uted by 
diabetic*.

TEAGUE DRUG STORE

Mrs. W. P. Florence 
Hostess to B.M.S.

Mrs. W. P. Florence was hostess 
to the General Missionary’ Society 
o f the First Baptist Church. 
Monday afternoon, November 13, 
at her homo on Powers street.

Mrs. E. C. Foster was leader of 
tho program, “ Royal Servlco," and 
Mcsdnmcs Daisy Martin, Wade D. 
Thompson, C. V. Young, Harry 
Stokes, Armes, Clifford Young, 
and A. C. Strickland took part on 
the program.

After tho program, Mrs. Harry 
Stokes, president, took chargo of 
the business meeting.

Refreshments of spiced tea, salad 
cuke nnd mints were served to 27 
members nnd one guest, Mrs. II. G. 
Stokes of Abilene.

Have your prescriptions filled at
TEAGUE DRUG STORE by a 

Registered Pharmacist

Breath Offends?
Bad breath is sometimes duo to bad 
teeth; often caused by sluggish 
bowels. To neglect it may invite 
a host of constipation’s other dis­
comforts; headaches, biliousness, 
loss of energy or appetite. Take 
spicy, all - vegetable B L A C K -  
DRAUGHT tonight This intesti­
nal tonic-laxative tones lasy bowel 
muscles; cleanses gently,promptly, 
thoroughly by simple directions. 
Try B L A C K -D R A U G H T , the 
time-tested laxative.

for economy 
safety, speed! <
It’s the modem way to ship .'. . 
and the cheapest tool We’ll 
carry any slse load to any 
point within 500 miles o f Slaton. 
Depend on Alcorn Transfer ft 
Storage for trucking needs!

PHONE 80

B1GV1LLE Bigville has more than 70,000 tele­
phone customers who make some 

POPULATION 400,000 gOOgCOOC«1U a day. Bigville’ .  tele­
phone system is big, complex . . .  a half million miles of 
wire . . . millions of dollars worth of intricate telephone 
equipment manned by hundreds of tele­
phone workers. Bigville's telephone sys­
tem is tailor-made for Bigville.

Littlevillc has 35 telephone cus­
tomers, served by a telephone sys­
tem made to order for their needs. 
An operator and one assistant 
handle the 150 calls a day.

Mrsj A. A. Sparkman 
Hoijess To Club

Mrs. A. A. Sparkman was hos­
tess to tho Mid-O-Wec Bridge 
Club Wednesday afternoon, Nov. 8, 
at her homo on West Crosby St.

High score was won by Miss 
Myrtle Teague. The Armistice 
theme was carried out in the re­

freshments. Those attending _ tvetf 
Mosdames Courtney Sandors/.Vern 
Johnson, Jr., Herschel Crawford? 
Geo. L em fln .^ y j S c ^ J .  P. Hall- . 
burton, Miss ..Myrtle Tcagu^ aw) 
tho hostess,’ Mr*. Sparkman, ,, ,,  j;1

Robert Scott and ArthllV 5ftk<!*a 
dock went to Austin for the holi­
days to visit friends andntttalllfce "  1 
A&M-SMU game. >n ■>;! -JnupfUi

■ s o l i

The Loveless - Groshart Clinic
General Surgery 

Medicine - Obstetrics 
Diagnosis

All Laboratory and X-Ray Work Available Locally
suit

ROY G. LOVELESS, M. a  0 . D. GHOSHART^^g. D.
Otis Neill, Bus. Mgr.

MODELGROCERY & MARKET
QUALITY AND SERVICE 

Phone 147

Everything for the
THANKSGIVING DINNER

If you demand flavor, then be sure to buy your meat from
us. Check our specials now.

We’ve selected the finest of foods, the freshest and best 
of everything—and we’re ready to deliver whenever you say 
the word.
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The Slaton Slatonite, Friday, November 17, 1939
Mrs. Edmbhdsoh ' 
Entertains

Mr*, if. H. Edmdndson e\ 
ed the m i  Bonnett Club* 
day nftornoon, November 
o’clock aj^tyr ji£jne\on South 10th

Plana Tbanksglv-
ing banquet to be bold on JSIayem-

', at 3

We H**e A Few
choice tActa of farm land to ahow 
you. Th*f are good and well worth 
the pried asked.

SEE US SOON
Alexander Land Co.

314 Myrick Bldg., Lubbock

Dependable \Jsad - All Sizes 
WATER WKIgi CASING 

PIPE - P I T T A S  - VALVES 
at substnmjal Ravings 

CENTRAL PIPE & SUPPLY CO 
2011 Av. H - Lubbock - Ph. GOO

ber 21, were made.
A refreshment plate carryin 

out the Thanksgiving motif wet 
served to the seventeen members 
present.

Tho next meeting will be at the 
homo o f Mrs. C. C. Wicker.

Sunshine Club Elects 
New Officers

Mrs. J. P. Spears entertained the 
Sunshine Sewing Ciub at her home 
Thursday, November Ninth.

The officers for tho ensuing 
year were elected ns follows: Pres­
ident, Mrs. Doug Keese, re-elected; 
vice president, Mrs. Travis- Irons; 
secretary, Mrs. Wutson.

Fourteen members were present. 
The next meeting will be in the 
home o f Mrs. W. P. Splnwn, Wed­
nesday, November 22.

Mrs. J. A. Elliott and Mrs. Guy 
Brown spent Tuesday in Lubbock. 
They attended the book review of 
“ Grapes of Wrath” reviewed by 
Mary Dell Buckner in the ball room 
of the Hilton I(otel.

Mrs. J. A. Bean, mother of Mrs. 
V. P. Williams, is on the sick list 
this week.

T U R K E Y S
for Thanksgiving 

also
Milk Fed Hens 

and Fryers 
Dressed while you 

wait
COME IN NOW AND SELECT 

YOUR BIRD

D R I V E R ’ S
H A T C H E R Y

Phono 378

BAND MOTHERS MET

The Band Mothers Club met Mon­
day night after the Band Concert, 
Mrs. W. T. Davis, president, wns in 
charge of the meeting. A report 
woh made on the rummage sale 
conducted for several weeks and it 
was declared closed on account of 
the disappearance of practically, 
all rummage. Mrs. Tanner reported 
on tho collection campaign for 
Slatonitc subscriptions. Plans were 
made for giving a series of “ forty- 
two” parties during the month of 
January, and announcement was 
made of tho Variety Show to be 
presented by the Band in December

Mrs. E. N. Pickens, who has been 
ill for several weeks, is improving, 
and is at her home southeast of 
Slaton.

Mrs. Paul P. Murray returned 
homo Sunday from Missouri, after 
spending three weeks visiting her 
brother, Mr. Roberts. Clydo Rob­
erts, who has been visiting his 
aunt, Mrs. Murray, returned to 
Missouri with her.

Mrs. G. R. Lcverett, Mr. and 
Mrs. G. A. Lcverett and daughter, 
LaBccn, of l'ortnles, New Mexico, 
arrived this week, and are visiting

Mrs. George Lemon, district 
chairman of Safety and Mrs. Dick 
Odom, district chairman o f Endow­
ment, spent Thursday in La mesa 
assisting in the Parent Teachers 
school o f Instructions held there. 
Mrs. P. B. Haynes and Mrs. W. R. 
Weaver, District president, Lub- 
bock, accompanied them.

Mr. and Mrs. J. II. Brewer return­
ed Sunday after visiting in Waco. 
Their daughter, Mrs. William Mc- 
David and son, Terry, returned with 
them.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Marriott 
of Spur spent last week-end visit­
ing his parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. E. 
Marriott.

Mrs. A. D. (Buster) Williams, 
j  nee Edda Belle Benton, of San Ber­
nardino, California arrived Tues­

day  and is visiting her mother, 
Mrs. A. C. Benton.

Miss Minnie Reo Knight of Cor-

Miss Maxine Odom spent last 
week-end visiting in the home of 
Miss Florence Baldwin of Lubbock.

Mr. and Mrs. C. E. Williams and 
sons, Tommie and John Earl, and 
Mr. and Mrs. E. M. Crosslcy and 

l, Emmltt, Jr., of Rising Star,

ing in the home of her son, Fred 
Stottlemire, 305 W. Garza St.

Mrs. W. A. Tucker and Mrs. S. 
E. Staggs spent Tuesday in Amar-

visited Mr. and Mrs. 
the past week-end.

Dick Odom

Miss Virginia Sanders of Wichi­
ta Falls spent last week-end visit­
ing her parents and sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. H. G. Sanders and Mrs. Geo. 
Lemon. Miss Sanders has n position 
with the Works Projects Adminis­
tration in Wichita Kails.

Mr*. W. A. Batson of Welling­
ton, Kansas spent last week visit

illo. Wfcllei theft t t t f  an
anniversary dlnnSr ih.tbe home of 
Mr. aftd Mrs. <?. W -, Owens. Mr. 
and Mrs. Owens ‘are 81a-
tonites, \. r.

*
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their daughter and sister, Mrs. E. Ji)US Cliristi is hero visiting her sis

P A L A C E
Presenting the New Season of 
______________Hits I

_  FPIPAY SATURDAY r -

When Your 
Foot's on 
the G as... 
Keep Gals 
Off Your

Mrs. Sikes Is 
Complimented

Complimenting Mrs. W. A. Sikes, 
Mosdamcs John Burton, Powers, 
Hoover, Ward, Goldin, Pohl, Mc­
Cullough and Hodge, were hos­
tesses ot the Slaton Club House, 
Tuesday afternoon at 2 o’clock.

The Club House decorations were 
carried out in the Thanksgiving 
motif. Five little girls dressed in 
orange paper dresses then brought 
in the covered basket of miscellan­
eous presents, and presented them 
to the honoree.

Refreshments were served to tho 
thirty-three guests present.

WATCH FOR THE 
VARSITY SHOW

You'll think Corinnc Catos’ Nov­
elty Tap Dance is worth the price 
of the big Vnrsity Show,, but when 
you sec Jim Ncvins and Coach 
Hamilton in their Hula Dance, you 
will want us to pass around the 
hat. Remember, Monday aight, De­
cember 11th.

R. Burns.

Judge C. Smith, farmer and 
stockman of North Slaton, went 
last weekend to East Texas inves­
tigating the horse market. He has 
a considerable number of fine 
young draft animals that are ready 
for market. The high adaptability 
of this level plains land for tractor 
farming makes the marketability 
of the stock less here than further 
cast where farms arc smaller and 
the land is not quite so level.

Mr. and Mrs. G. W. Dodson and 
niece, Mary Theresa Rankin, of 
Post were in Slaton last week visit­
ing J. D. Rankin, jr.

ter, Mrs. Roy Foutz.

kUck
eompleU
b»rk

22;
i E ?™ .'
! SSIa'

i ftonMb 
fluid* tuna

PHO. 289 We Deliver

EAVES PRODUCE
Coal, sack feed, alfalfa hay, fresh 

fruit, East Texas syrup, valley oranges 
and grapefruit.

Will pay more cash for your poultry 
and hides. Bring us your cream.

Your Business Appreciated

SLATON ART CLUB 
POSTPONES PARTY

Announcement wns made this 
week by the president of th<5 Sla­
ton Art Club, Mrs. C. L. Tanner, 
that the forty-two parties sponsor-* 
cd by the Club will be postponed 
next Monday, November 20, until 
the following Monday, Novcmher 
27. The public is cordially invited 
to attend.

you

been look1»<j l̂ rl up'
G u a r a n te ed  I $ 1.00

City Drug Store 23

80 ACRES
well Improved 
$3600.00 

5-room house, 8 acres, well wind 
mill, tank

$1750.00
2-room house, 2 lots, on highway

$375.00
A. B. GRIFFITH

F10 S. Ninth Slaton

WE HAVE new cylinder recondition­
ing equipment; also new equipment for 
refacing valves and resetting heads on 
all Tractors.

O.D. Kenney Auto Parts
Phone 348 Slaton, Texas

APPENDICITIS
is an inflammation or excessive hetrit of 
the vermiform appendix, involving the 
surrounding peritoneum and charac­
terized by fever, pain and localized 
tenderness. Inflamation ofSithe appen­
dix may be simple, ulcerative or inrtesw 
tinal. ' , ,

The action of the appendix is cjtm- 
troled by the nerves. The nerye* c&rne 
from the spine.

CHIROPRACTIC ‘ ! 
adjustment removes the cause and na­
ture will get you well. TRY FOR 
YOURSELF.

Dr. C. H. Mcllroy is equipped to 
handle your case.

DR. C. H. 1MLR0Y
Chiropractor

Electro Therapy — Colonic Therapy. 
Phone 444

Slaton, Texas

Mrs. E. R. Bums returned homo 
Saturday evening after being call­
ed to Tulin to the bedside of her 
dnughtcr, Miss Mary Catherine, 
who underwent an appendectomy 
last Wednesday. At last reports, 
Miss Mary Catherine wns doing 
exceptionally well. Miss Burns is 
a nurse in the Swisher County Hos­
pital at Tulin.

Have your prescriptions filled at 
TEAGUE DRUG STORE by i 

Registered Phsrmsclst
also DONALD DUCK Cartoon 

and NEWS

PRBVUE SATURDAY NIGHT 
------ SUNDAY - MONDAY-------

Danger drew him as a magnet draws Iron!
w .

G l O f W

•^SSSSS&l

REE to
T O M A C H I 
'OFFERERS.'

Why aulier the intenee 
pain o f ulcers, indiges­
tion. gas, heartburn, or 
headaoheii caused by 

excess acidity? Ask 
for a FREE Sample 
of Udga Tablet*, a 
stom ach special 
lat'a formula. Ovar^
500,000 u««r* pr.U. I h«•ma.ln* r.U.1 IM*. ha* »t».n th.m

RED CROSS PHARMACY

r -

$25.00 REWARD
Will be paid by the manufacturers 
for any Com GREAT CHRISTO­
PHER Corn Remedy cannot re- 
more. Also removes Warts and Cal­
louses. 35c at

CITY DRUG STORE

HOW would you like to 
buy or trade 
for a bargain?

I want to dispose of my Grocery store 
on South 9th.

------  TUESDAY ONLY ------
Cheater Morrls-Wendy narrle
“ Five Came Back”
2 Adult* 25c — 2 Children 10c

Thq World’s Best Selling Book
We have a complete stock

Personal stationery-your mono­
gram at no extra cost.

Electric Razors, Schick and
Remington-Rand

LAY AWAY NOW FOR XMAS

SLATON PHARMACY

I will sell or trade all or part, the 
building and keep the stock, or will sell 
the stock and fixtures and rent the 
building.

I am interested in trading for proper­
ty below the Cap Rock.

See me at 330 South 9th for some one 
is going to get a bargain.

P. M. PORTER

MERCY HOSPITAL 

CONDUCTED BY SISTERS OF MERCY 

LOCAL STAFF:
Dr. W. E. Payne Dr. R. G.,LQ)̂ efcft9i. 

Dr. O. D. Grosnart ,-i / ';i Vf.
DENTAL SURC^<S$ :

Dr. G. W. Shanks
THIS AD SPONSORED BY

RED CROSS PHARMACY

m

E njoy

C om fort  and C on ven ien ce  

this W in te r  <

w ii k .

N a t u r a l  G a s  H e a t

West Texas Gas Co.

WE CAN DO SOME STRUTTING 
TOO '

November 20th
is our special week for preparing 

cars for
WINTER MONTHS AHEAD 

Let us get under the hood of that 
car with Antifreeze, proper 

winter motor oil, differentialamd 
transmission lubricants - *

JEFF CUSTER S
24 HOUR SERVICE 

Road Service

- J f f l l l i M I f i l
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Germany’s GunsFace WestTowards ‘NoM an’sLand’AGRICULTURE: 
Cotton and WheatWEEKLY NEWS ANALYSIS BY JOSEPH W. LaBINE LUBBOCK

SANITARIUM & CLINIC
Medic*'. Hurt leal. »nd DlignostWitch-Belgian Arbitration Bid 

jost in Beer Hall Excitement; 
Fear of Nazi Invasion Mounts

Three Items made news for cot­
ton and wheat fartners as November 
Sot underway:

tl) With 10,100,000 bales of sur­
plus cotton stored under govern­
ment loan, and with an M.D45.000- 
bale crop (slightly less than 1938) 
forecast for this year, the agricul­
ture department announced loans 
based at 8.3 cents a pound on seven- 
eighths inch middlings would be 
available to 1039 growers who plant­
ed within their acreage allotments. 
A week earlier the loan program 
seemed stymied by increased cot­
ton consumption thanks to the war.

43) The bureau of agricultural 
economics forecast the same wheat 
acreage for 1940 as for 1939, i. e., 
64,600,000 acres, which would pro­
duce about 760.000,000 bushels of 
spring and winter wheat. But next 
year’s yield will be under par un­
less unusually favorable weather 
comes along. Reason: Drouth has 
already damaged much seeded win­
ter wheat beyond recovery.

(3) Closing its first year, the fed­
eral crop insurance corporation was 
sad. Having taken 6.769,120 bush­
els of wheat as premiums from 165.- 
551 farmers, the corporation had 
claims from one-fourth its custo­
mers. Indemnities paid, totaling 
9,461,730 bushels, brought a loss of

General Surgery 
Dr. J. T. Krueger 
Dr. J. II. Stiles 
Dr. Hcnrio E. Mast

Eye. Ear. Nose & Throat 
Dr. J. T. Hutchinson 
Dr. Den B. Hutchinson 
Dr. E. M. Blake 

Infants & Children 
Dr. M. 0. Overton 
Dr. Arthur Jenkins

General Medicine
Dr. J. I*. Lnttimore 
Dr. II. C. Maxwell 
Dr. G. S. Smith 

Obstetrics 
Dr. O. R. Hand 

Internal Mcdldbe 
Dr. K. H. McCatlyV 

X-ilay & LaboratoW 
Dr. James D. Wilsojf

(EDITOR'S NOTE—When opinions are expressed In the.se columns, they 
are those of the news analyst and not necessarily of this newspaper.)

Released by Western Newspaper

Resident
Dr. Wayne Rccscr

STEEL, .MILLS BLOSSOM AT GARY, 1ND. 
Som e induuriet expand; neutrality ttiflex others. J. II. Felton

limine** Mtr.
C. E. Hunt
gapcrinlendrnlCamouflaged with clumps of grass and branches of trees, this mighty piece of German artillery faees west 

as a gun crew watches aetlvity on the other side of "no man's land," somewhere in Germany. This pic­
ture is one of the first made on the Nazi side of the western front.Finance corporation.

The government restricted foreign 
commerce in some quarters and ex­
panded it in others. Approved was 
a new reciprocal trude pact with 
Venezuela, "freezing" tariff sched­
ules on exports of wheat flour, oat­
meal, lard and lumber. In return, 
the U. S. will reduce import taxes 
50 per cent on Venezuelan crude 
petroleum.

Meanwhile, an inter-administra­
tion squabble flared over the U. S. 
maritime commission's transfer of 
more than 40 ships to foreign regis­
try us a means of avoiding the ban, 
on American shipping in belligerent 
zones. Secretary of State Cordell

TRADE & INDUSTRY X-RAY AND RADIUM 
PATHOLOGICAL LABORATORY 

SCHOOL OP NURSINGabout $1,885,000.

Pensioneers Defeated on 'Ham andRepeal of the U. S. arms embargo, 
which keeps American ships out of 
combat zones and allows belligerents 
"cash and carry" rights, not only 
set off a partial business boom at 
home but also brought major reper­
cussions in world diplomatic, trade 
and maritime circles. A survey by 
the Northwestern National Life In­
surance company showed luxury 
and semi-luxury goods began mov­
ing swiftly in September, but Fed­
eral Works Administrator John Car- 
mod.v spiked any boom hopes: Only 
500,000 of the 9,000,000 unemployed 
can expect new jobs.

There was cautious expansion in

RUSSIA:
Unhappy Birthday

Twenty-two years ago a bloody 
revolution gave birth to the U. S. 
S. R. Only a month ago Soviet 
Premier Viacheslav Molotov showed 
Russia's strapping maturity by de­
nouncing President Roosevelt’ s in­
tervention in the Finnish-Russian 
scrap. When Moscow began its 
three-day anniversary celebration. 
Premier Molotov again slapped the

Alcorn Transfer
AND STORAGE WAREHOUSE 

Local and Long Distance Hauling 
Phone* 80 — 278J 

ALL KINDS OF STORAGE

ROCKWELL BROS, 
LUMBERMEN 

Phone 15Hull objected, not because the step 
was Illegal, but because it would, 
violate the integrity and spirit of 
the neutrality law. Commented 
Maritime Commissioner Max O’ Uell 
Truitt. "I  don’ t see any element of 
a dodge at all: I think it's a com­
pletely sound, bona flde situation all 
around." President Roosevelt final­
ly decided against the transfer, 
promising to change his mind later 
if tension cased. Meanwhile. C. I. 
O.’ s maritime union estimated 10.- 
000 U. S. seamen were thrown out 
of work by the neutrality provision 
banning nationals from combat 
Zones. (At Washington the President 
ronuillrd A. F. of L.’t William Green 
and C. I. O.’i ]$hn l.eu it on thit prob­
lem, alto discussing the chaneet for 
labor peace.)

Trade with belligerents zoomed. 
Even Switzerland, minus a navy, 
chartered two ships. The state de­
partment warned shippers to de­
mand cash from their foreign cus­
tomers. and the cash was apparent­
ly forthcoming because Britain's 
parliament rushed through a billion 
dollar fund to carry on the war.

U. S. industry, where building
awards for October totaled $49,910,- 
000 against $fi.814.000 a year ago. 
Many firms announced stock divi­
dends payable in December. Rail­
roads, which coupled their expan­
sion with a plea that they might be 
permitted to operate without govern­
ment interference in times of emer­
gency, were offered a new recovery 
program by 

Join-.-.
federal loan 1 A t*  
u d m i n i s t r a -  1 - 'ft
to r  T hi s  j l
p lan,  u sed  dTgOK Y

WILLIAMS 
FUNERAL HOME

SLATON, TEXAS

Embalming and Funeral Directing 

Ambulance Service

Phone 125
HANS THOMSEN AND WIFE Still smiling are the Allen brothers, Willis (left) and Lawrence (center), promoters of the "ham and 

eggs" pension plan which proved to be an unpalatable dish for California voters, who emphatically rejected 
(he scheme In a special election. The plan called for the payment of $30 in warrants every Thursday to each 
unemployed Californian over 50. Right: Rev. Herbert Bigelow, proponent of Ohio's pension plan, which, like 
California’ s, was flatly rejected by voters. Bigelow's plan called for an Income of $50 per month to Ohioans

Mott radiant oj all.
U. S.: " .  . . in the case of certain 
countries neutrality only serves ns 
a mask to conceal their activi­
ties . .

On that same day in Washington, 
the Soviet embassy decorated Len­
in's statue with red roses, assem­
bled Scotch whisky and Russian 
soda, green sherbet in crushed rasp­
berries, and cakes smothered in 
rum sauce Awaited were the guests 
to help Charge d'Affaircs Dmitri 
Chuvakhln celebrate. But he was 
embarrassingly disappointed.

Absent were all Supreme court 
justices, cabinet members, senators 
and high ranking stale department 
officials Only China. Turkey and 
Ecuador sent their diplomats. Only 
prominent New Dealers: NLRB's 
Edwin Smith, SEC's Leon Hender­
son. and Mr*. Thurman Arnold, 
wife of the assistant attorney gen­
eral. Most beaming visitors: Hnns 
Thomsen, German charge d ’affaires, 
and his pretty wife, accompanied

Dr. C. H. Mclroy
CHIROPRACTOR 

ELECTRO-THERAPY 
110 Texas Avc. Phone 444

In  Other W ords— ‘D on 't  D isturb the P ilot ' H elp  F rom  the Sky

G. V. PARDUE
LAWYER 

7 -8  Brown Bldg. 
LUBBOCK. TEXASEUROPE:

Cause Celebre?
"This," said Prime Minister 

Chamberlain, “ is not a state of war 
but • state of siege." Hr was not 
far wrong. The French claimed 
nine of their U. S. made planes had 
downed one-third of a 27-plane Ger­
man force over the western front 
There was also a mysterious battle 
in the North sea from which the

Refrigerators
RENTED AND SOLD 

Complete Rebuilding Plant

Delta Electric Co.
ay Phone 84 Night Phone 1925 
1104 Main St., Lubbock, Texas

INSURE—In Sure—INSURANCE 
Insurance of All Kinds 

AUTO LOANS 
Sco

J. H. BREWER
115 So. Dili Phones. 17 and 68

POLITICS:
No Ham,  No Epps

CONGRESS:
Committee Time

Home to the stamping grounds 
went most senators and congress­
men when the special neutrality ses­
sion adjourned. But between ses­
sions is a fine time for committee 
hearings. Still in session is Murtin 
Dies’ un-Amcricanlim group, bally- 
hootng for another appropriation. 
Two other groups, working out legis­
lative suggestions for next Janu­
ary's term, are:

House Tax Subcommittee. Open­
ing its hearings under Tennessee's 
Rep. Jere Cooper, the committee 
talked about broadening income tax 
bases. But there was a disinclina­
tion to offer concrete proposals. It 
was announced final determination 
of a program will await the opening 
of congress. Two official reasons: 
(1) The treasury Is studying taxes, 
soliciting suggestions from business 
and industry: (2> National defense 
needs for the next fiscal year arc 
not yet known. Besides, the com­
mittee is wondering about taxes on 
excess war profits, not knowing 
where to turn. Equally important, 
how would tax revision be received 
in an election year like 1940?

M l Washington. Srcrelars of the 
Treasury Morgenthau told reimrleri 
any initiative for raising the II. S. debt 
limit above $45,000,000,000 mint rome 
from congress, not from himself or the 
White Haute. Present debt: About 
$41.000,000,000.)

NLRB Investigating Committee.
Deferring hearings until its Chair­
man Howard Smith (Dcm., Va.) 
gets well, the house labor commit­
tee found new kindling for its cam­
paign against the labor board in a 
new strike technique, the "slow­
down." Defined Ohio's Rep. Harry 
Routzohn: "The slowdown is al­
most the same as the sitdown." Its 
origin, he said, could be traced to 
the northwest lumber camps, thence 
to the recent Chrysler strike.

The tumultuous 1930s hove brought 
an unprecedented thirst for secur­
ity taking form in unorthodox pen­
sion schemes. Most schemes were 
born in California, like Towmendism 
and EPIC. In November’ s elections 
two more panaceas went down to de­
feat, but there were signs many a 
politician might follow them.

Ohio's Rev. Herbert S. Bigelow 
promised to "continue the fight" for 
his badly snowed-under plan to give 
a ll p erson s  
o v e r  60 a
i f m W  ^
J.-rf) a month - v jv l j

This poster, distributed In Italy, shows Premier Mussolini at the 
controls of his bombing plane which bears the Inscription: "The Italian 
people know that they must not disturb the pilot, especially when he Is 
engaged In tempestuous navigation; nor ask notice of the route at every 
turn.”  The insrription, of course, applies to Italy's stand on the Inter­
national situation. Italy's diplomatic course is not to be questioned by 
Its people.

A "suicide squad" of women par­
achute Jumpers to offer first aid to 
wounded soldiers behind front lines 
Is advocated by Marie McMillan, 
New York, holder of the world's 
parachute Jumping record for wom­
en. The services of the "battalion of 
m ercy" will be offered to France, 
said Miss McMillan.

When you begin adver­

tising in this paper you 
start on the road to more 
business. There is no 
better or cheaper me­

dium for reaching the 
b u y e r s  of th is  pom- 
munity . . v , .

End o f  T iger G rid Star's P laying Career
D ca d cy c  G om ez

come tax and 
a l e v y  on 
rea l estate.

In Califor- 
n l a d i e d  
"h a m -a a d • 
e g g  f ."  t h e 
s c h e m e  to  

$30 ev-

WILIIELMINA AND LEOPOLD

give
e r y T h u r s -  Soothing uaidi. 
day to everyone over 50. It even 
trailed in Los Angeles county, 
its birthplace. One reason: Gyv.
Culbcrt Olson had fought hamnnd- 
*SS* by promising "useful and pro­
ductive employment" to all who 
wanted It, as a reward for defeating 
the plan. As pension leaders began 
a recall move against Mr. Olson, 
the governor soothed them. "This 
defeat doesn't mean that California 
is against the further development 
of sound social security . . . "

Other results: In New York, voters 
ignored Mayor Florella LaGuardla's 
protest by legalizing pari-mutuel 
race betting. Tammany won most 
local elections, while Republicans 
won a single upstate congressional 
race. In Kentucky. New Dealer 
Keen Johnson succeeded Sen. A. B. 
Chandler to the governor's chair. In 
Pennsylvania. Boles Penrose II, a 
Republican, lost a congressional 
contest.

Queen Wilhelmina. Moreover, they 
heard rumors that Adolf Hitler 
would Invade on November 15, 
claiming as an excuse that the allies 
would do likewise 1? Germany didn't 
invade first.

Though steadfastly denying any 
German "ultimatum" for a state­
ment of their positions, the king and 
queen held alt-night consultations 
with their foreign ministers. Re­
sult: A peace appeal was dispatched 
to all combatants offering Bclgian- 
Dutch mediation services. Britain 
rejected It politely.

Fuehrer Hitler was less polite. 
Not waiting to reply directly, he 
hnstened to the beer hall at Munich 
where his notorious putsch took 
place In 1933. There, on N azism 's 
aUteenth birthday, he scorned 
peace: "There can be only one
victor—that is we."

Hardly had Hitler left the beer

W e also can provide

Artistic
Printing

of every description

dom e In New York from a boat­
ing trip to the New Brunswick 
woods, Vernon "L efty " Gomes, 
pitching nee for the Yankees, hold* 
the CD-pound bear cnb be dropped 
with one shot. It should make a 
beautiful rug.

Don Herring. Inset, 31-year-eld football and track alar at Princeton 
university, la carried off the field after receiving an Injury that resulted 
In the loss of hi* left teg. The youth, who aided In a 28 to II victory 
over Brown, was Injured In the first quarter of the game. Examination 
revealed that ligaments below the knee were lorn and three main ar­
teries had been severe?. The amputation was made necessary because of 
the danger of gangrene becoming acute.
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Rotten Apples
— * —

W ERE you over a youngster 
back East, where they 

bought apples by the barrel and 
stored them in the cellar over 
against the long winter cveningsT 

When winter came, did you 
spend most ot your Saturdays 
sorting over the barrels of apples, 
picking out the rotten ones so 
thoy would not make the whole 
barrel that wnyT 

And didn't you and the family 
eat nothing but rotten apples the 
next week?

Isn't life like that?
And didn’ t you live in the kitch- 

en, because the parlor should not 
be mussed up? And isn't it the 
truth that you lived In the kitchen 
all your life?

And didn't you always wear 
your old clothes, because you had 
to keep the good ones to go to 
meeting on Sunday? And as a re­
sult, wcrcaMyou run down at the 
heel andJJfifohed on the seat most 
of the t£wc$

And ain you ever get over it? 
H aven’ t you gone through life 

with an inferiority com plex, hold­
ing m usty ideas and m ost o f the 
tim e the sam e old worn-out no­
tions until they were ready for the 
grab-bag? Do you still wait for 
som ebody else to step ahead and 
do tiic pioneering?

You d o—if you 're still eating 
rotten apples.—VV. L. Y. Davis, in 
Los Angeles Tribune,
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Lesson for November 19

CHAPTER XV—Continued

Gems of Thought

N OIt ilrrm ilia* irrevocable |>a*t a- 
wholly w nlril, wholly vain, i( 

rifting on il« wrrrkft, at lari to seine 
thing nobler we aliatti;-- Longfellow.

Happinctft never lays it, finger on 
lift puls*. If wc attempt to nival a 
glimpse of it* features, il disappears. 
—/Ilexarulrr Smith.

At a moili gnaws a garment, «o doth 
envy consume a man.—Chrysostom.

Better it were, that all the miseries 
which nature owns were ours at once, 
than guilt.—Shakespeare.

Be at wrfr with your vices, at peace 
with your neighbors, and let every 
year find you a heller man.—Franklin.

Courage dors not consist in the 
absence of fear, but the subjugation 
of fear.

It is as easy to call back a stone 
thrown from the hand, as to call back 
the word that is spoken.—Menander.
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FA ST R ELIEF
FROM PAIRS OF

R H EU M A T IS M , N EU R ITIS  
H EAD AC H E

A TABLET 
NOW BUYS 
GENUINE 

BAYER ASPIRIN

_______ __ by atop srateh. a gaaataa Bane
AoM s Tsbtot starts to dlatatograto and to 
aaaiy to go to werk. ttoa fas yewMlf Ibto nay, 
why Bayw Aspirin acta aa qakUy.

Millions now enjoy modem 
speed m ethod and save 
money they once spent for 
high-priced remedies. Try it.
You may bo surprised at the speed 
with which Bayer Aspirin brings re­
lief from headache and pains of
rheumatism, neuritis, neuralgia. 
Among the fastest, most effective 
ways Known, Bayer Aspirin not 
only brings relief from such pains 
•very fast. . .  but this quick way is

S  inexpensive. It may save the 
irs once spent on high priced 
remedies.

Once you try i t . . .  actually feel 
its quick relief, you’ll know why 
thousands moke sure they get no 
substitutes for Bayer 
Aspirin by always 
asking for it by its full 
name. . .  never by the 
name "aspirin”  alone.

Demand B A Y E R  A S P I R I N

HANTS
•Yo'i 
Advertising 
Dollar
buys something more than 
space and circulation in 
the columns of this news­
paper. It buys spsco and 
circulation plus the favor- 
ablo consideration of oar 
readers for this newspaper 
and its advertising patrons.

LET US TELL YOU  
M ORE ABOUT IT

Then Eloise and Edith came in. 
and presently the men, and Lucy 
and Del from a trip to the small 
porkers, and Adelaide going out with 
Del to dinner was uncomfortably 
aware that Jane had either artlessly 
or artfully refused to discuss with 
her the women who had been loved 
by Frederick Townc!

The dinner was delicious. "Our 
(arm products," Dclaflcld boasted. 
Even the fish. It seemed, he had 
enught that morning, motoring over 
to the river and bringing them back 
to be split and broiled and served 
with little new potatoes. There was 
chicken ond asparagus, small cream 
cheeses with the salad, henped-up 
berries in a Royal Worcester bowl, 
roses from the garden. "All home­
grown." said the proud new hus­
band.

June ate with little uppetite. She 
had refused to discuss with Adelaide 
the former heart afTairs of her be­
trothed. but the words rang In her 
cars. ‘The women Uiat Ricky has 
loved.”

Jane was young. And to youth, 
love is for the eternities. The 
thought of herself as one of a sue- 
ression of Dulcincas was degrading. 
She was restless nnd unhappy. It 
was useless to assure herself that 
Towne had chosen her above all the 
rest. She was not sophisticated 
enough to assume that It is. per­
haps. better to be a man’s last love 
than his first. That Townc had made 
it possible for any woman to speak 
of him ns Adclnidc spoke, seemed 
to Jane to drag her own relation to 
him In the dust.

The strength of the wind In­
creased. The table was sheltered 
by the house, but at last Dclaflcld 
decided, “ We'd better go In. The 
rain is coming. We can have our 
colTce in the hall."

Their leaving had the effect of a 
stampede. Big drops splashed into 
the plates. The men servants and 
maids scurried to the rescue of 
china and linen.

The draperies of the women 
streamed In the wind. Adelaide's 
tulle was a banner of green and 
blue. The peacock enme swiftly up 
the walk, crying raucously, and 
found a sheltered spot beneath the 
steps

From the wide hall, they saw the 
rain in silver sheets. Then the doors 
were shut.against the beating wind.

They drank their cofTec, and 
bridge tables were brought in. There 
were enough without Jane to form 
two tables. And she was glad. She 
wandered Into the living-room and 
curled herself up in a window-seat 
The window opened on the porch. 
Beyond the white pillars she could 
sec.the road, and the rain-drenched 
garden.

After a time the rnln stopped, 
and the world showed clear as crys­
tal against the opal brightness of 
the western sky. The peacock came 
out of his hiding-place, and dragged 
a long, heavy tall over the sodden 
lawn.

It was cool nnd the air was sweet. 
Jane lay with her head against a 
cushion, looking out She was lonely 
and wished that Towne would come. 
Perhaps In his presence her doubts 
would vanish. It grew dark and 
darker. Jane shut her eyes and at 
last she fell asleep.

She was waked by Towne's voice. 
He was on the porch. “ Where is 
everybody?"

It was Adelaide who answered 
him. "They have motored Into Alex­
andria to the movies. Eloise would 
hove IL But 1 stayed—waiting for 
you. Ricky."

“ Where's Jane?"
"She went up-stairs early. Like 

o sleepy child.”
Jane heard his laugh. “ She Is a 

child—a darling child."
Then In the darkness Adelaide 

sold. “ Don't Ricky."
"Why not?”
"D o you remember that once 

upon a time you called me—a dar­
ling child?"

"Did I? W ell perhaps you were. 
You are certainly • very charming 
woman."

Jane, listening breathlessly, as­
sured herself that of course he was 
polite. He bad to be.

Adelaide was speaking. "So you 
are solng to make the announcement 
tomorrow?"

“ Who told you?"
"Edith."
"W ell It seemed best, Adelaide. 

The wedding day Isn't far off—and 
the world will have to know IL"

A nushed moment then. "Oh. 
Ricky. R ickyl"

“ Adelaldel Don't take It like 
that"

“ I can't help IL You are going 
out ot my llfo. And you've always 
been so strong, and big. and brave. 
No other man wlU ever match you.”

When he spoke, his voice had a 
new nnd softer note. ” 1 didn't dream 
it would hurt you."

"You might have known."
The llghmlng flickering along the 

horizon showed Adelaide standing 
beside Towne's chair.

"R ick y" — the whispered words 
reached Jane—"kiss mo one*—to 
say 'good -by.'"  «

CHAPTER XVI

Young Baldwin Barnes, on Satur­
day morning, ate breakfast alone In 
the little house. He read his paper 
and drank his cofTce. But the savor 
of things was gone. He missed 
Jane. Her engaging chatter, the 
spirited challenge, even the small ir 
rltations. “ She is such a darling 
dear," was his homesick meditation.

Oh. a man needed a woman on 
the other side ot the table. And 
when Jane was married, what then?

Edithl
Oh. If he might! If Philomel might 

sing tor her! Toast and poachea 
eggs! Nectar and ambrosial His 
little house a castle!

"But it Isn’ t mine own." the young 
poet reminded himself; “ there is 
still the mortgage." He came down 
to earth, cleared tne table, ted the 
pussy-cats. Then he went down to 
the post-box to get the mall.

The Barnes’ mail was rarely vo­
luminous. rarely Interesting. A bill 
or two. a letter from Judy—some 
futile advertising stuff.

This morning, however, there was 
a long envelope. In one corner was 
the name of the magazine to which, 
nearly six months before, Baldy had 
sent his prize cover design. The

Towne, riding like mad along
the Virginia roads.

thing had almost gone out of his 
thoughts. He had long ceased to 
hope. Money did not miraculously 
fall Into one’ s lap.

He tore open the envelope. With­
in was a closely typed letter and a 
pale pink check.

The check was for two thousand 
dollars. He had won the prize!

Breathless with the thought of IL 
deprived ot strength, he sat down 
on the terrace steps. Merrymaid 
and the kitten came down and an­
gled for attention, but Baldy over­
looked them utterly. The letter 
was astounding. The magazine had 
not only given him the prize but they 
wanted more of his work. They 
would pay well for It—and If he 
would come to New York at their 
expense, the art editor would like to 
talk It over!

Baldy, looking up from the preg­
nant phrases and catching Merry- 
maid’s eye upon him, demanded, 
"Now. what do you think of that? 
Shall I resign from the office? I’ ll 
tell the world. I will."

Oh. the thing might even make II 
possible for him to marry Edith. 
He could ot least pay for the honey­
m oon-preserve some sense of per­
sonal Independence while he worked 
towards fame. If she would only 
see IL That he must ask her to live 
for a time—In the little house. He'd 
make things easy for her—oh, well, 
the thing could be done—It could be 
done.

He flew up the steps on the wings 
of his deltgbL He would ride like 
the wind to Virginia—find Edith In a 
rose-garden, fling himself at her 
feeL Declare his good fortune! And 
he would see her eyes!

Packing his bsg, he decided to 
stop In Washington, and perpetrate 
a few extravagances. Something for 
Edith. Something for Jane. Some­
thing for himself. There would be 
no harm in looking his best . . .

He arrived at Grass Hills In time 
for lunch. Hit little flivver came up 
the drive as proudly as a limou­
sine. And Baldy descending was 
a gay and gallant flgure. There was 
no one in sight but the servants who 
took hit bag. and drove his car 
around to the garage. A maid in 
rose linen said that Mr. and Mrs. 
Simms were at the stables. Miss 
Towne was on the links with the 
other guests, and would return from 
the Country Club In time for lunch 
at two o'clock. Miss Barnes was 
up stairs. Her head had ached, and 
she had hod her breakfast In bed.

"Will you let her know that I am 
here?"

The maid went up and com e down 
to say that Miss Barnes was In the
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second gallery—and would be go 
right up.

The second gallery looked out 
over the river. Jane lay In a long 
chair. She was palo. and there were 
shadows under her eyes.

“ Oh, look here, Janey.”  Baldy 
blurted ouL "is  it as bad as this?"

"I 'm  Just—lazy." She sat up and 
kissed him. Then burled her face In 
his coat and wept silently.

"F or heaven's sake. Jane," he pat­
ted her shoulder, “ what’ s the mat­
ter?”

“ I want to go home.”
He looked blank. “ Home?”
“ Yes.”  She stopped crying. 

“ Baldy, something has happened— 
and I’ve got to tell you." Tensely, 
with her hands clasped about her 
knees, she rehearsed for him the 
scene between Adelaide and Fred­
erick Towne. And when she flnished 
she said. ” 1 can't marry him."

” 01 course noL A girl like you. 
You'd be miserable. And that's the 
end of IL”

"Utterly miserable." ■ She stared 
before her. Then presently she went 
on. “ 1 stayed up-stalrs all the morn­
ing. Lucy and Edith have been 
perfect dears. 1 think Edith lays It 
to the announcement ot my engage­
ment tonight. That 1 was dread­
ing it. Of course it mustn't be an­
nounced. Baldy."

He stood up, sternly renouncing 
his dreams. “ Get your things on. 
Jane, ond I'll lake you home. You 
can't stay here, of course. We can 
decide later what It is best to do.”

"I don't see how I can break it oil. 
He's done so much (or us. 1 can't 
ever—pay him—"

In Bnldy's pocket was the pink 
slip. He took it out and handed it 
to his sister. "Jane. I got the prize. 
Two thousand dollars."

“ BaldyI”  Her tone was Incredu­
lous.

He had no Joy in the announce­
ment. The thing had ceased to mean 
freedom—It had ceased to mean— 
Edith. It meant only one thing at 
the momenL to free Jane from bond­
age.

He gave Jane the letter ond she 
read it. "It Is your great oppor 
tunity."

“ Yes.”  He refused to discuss that 
aspect of IL "And It comes In the 
nick of time for you. old dear.”

Their flight was a hurried one. A 
note for Lucy and one for Towne. 
A note for Edithl

Jane was not well was the reason 
given their hostess. The note to 
Townc said more than that. And 
the note left for Edith was—renun 
elation.

Edith coming home to luncheon 
found the note in her room. All 
the morning she had been filled with 
glorious anticipation. Baldy would 
arrive in a few hours. Together 
they would walk down that trelllscri 
path to the fountain, they would sit 
on the marble coping. She would 
trail her hand through the water. 
Further than that she would not let 
her imagination carry her. It was 
enough that she would see him In 
that magic place with bis air of 
golden youth.

But she was not to sec him, for 
the note said:

"Beloved—I make no excuse for 
calling you that because I say it 
always in my heart—Jane has made 
up her mind that she cannot marry 
your uncle. So wc are leaving at 
once.

"1 can't tell you what the thought 
of these two days with you meant 
to me. And now I must give them 
up. Perhaps 1 must give you up. 
I don't know. I came with high 
hopes. 1 go away without any hope 
at olL But I love you."

Edith read the note twice, then 
put It to her Ups. She hardly dared 
admit to herself the keenness of 
her disappointment.

She stood for a long time at the

H O U S EH O LD
Q U E S T IO N S
New Hot-Water Bottle.—Add a'

teaspoonful of glycerine to the hot 
water when filling a new rubber 
hot-water bottle for the first time. 
This keeps the rubber soft and in 
good condition.

• • •
When Glass Breaks.—A handful

of moistened absorbent cotton will 
pick up bits of broken glass with­
out endangering the fingers.

WARNINGS AND PROMISES
Removing Odors.—Odors can  be 

lesson t e x t —Matthew i:M L  j rem oved from  bottles by rinsing 
She stood for a long time at the I ..GOLDEN TEXT—And as y« would with co ld  water to which a little 

window looking out. Why had Jane | I X ^ V e w U ^ .- L u k  e?3L d° *U°  j dry m ustard is added.
decided not to marry Uncle Fred- ---------  ! * * *
erick? What had happened since j "How to Win Friends and Influ- Care of Electric Cord— Don’t
yesterday afternoon? j cnee People** may be worthwhile to *wl5**» bend or tie the so-called

From Edith's window she could 1 study, unless it is done from a pure- corc* C a c h e d  to your e lectric iron,
see the south lawn. The servants 1 jy selfish desire to be popular so 11 is not a cord. but two bundles
were arranging a buffet luncheon, j that one may make more money j of w ires-
Little tables were set around—and j  and get on in the world. Everyone | ......—  - ■ ■■ 1
wicker chairs. Adelaide, tall and j should desire to make more friends !

and bettor friends, and the Chris­
tian In making friends should make 
them for his Lord as well ns for 
himself. Actually Uie best of the

fair, In her favorite blue and a broad ; 
black hat stood by one of the little 
tables. She was feeding the pea- : 
cock with bits of bread. She made

* ̂ J E 9I ,s i ! .2N
sad One Dote Frosts 11

ir lb* Orn duM of thU oU.»»»nt-Uit!ni Iltfto 
tUrk uliUt Ilomn't brills »ou th» IiiUsl snd nmt

a picture, and Towne's window ruies , nd suggestions offered on this tS fw w 'S S  sWoovnuFSoNc? luck.'

By not Judging others censoriously 
we escape such Judgment of our­
selves both by God ond by our fel­
low man. The admonition. "Judge

faced that way
"I  wonder—"  Edith said, and 

stopped. She remembered comuig 
In from the movies the night be­
fore and finding Adelaide and Towne 
out on the porch. And where was 
Jane?

Towne did not eat lunch. He 
pleaded important business, and had 
his car brought around. But every­
body knew that he was following 
Jane. Mystery was in the atr. Ade­
laide was restless. Only Edith knew 
the truth.

After lunch, she told Lucy. "Jane 
Isn't going to marry Uncle Fred. 1 
don't know why. But I am afraid 
that it is breaking up your house 
party."

"I hope It Is," said Lucy, calmly.
"Delaficld Is bored to death. He 
wants to get back to his pigs and 
roses. 1 am speaking frankly to 
you because I know you understand.
I want our lives to be bigger and j  ™ctlng our own faults will serve a 
broader than they would have been 
If wc hadn't meL And as for you"
—her voice shook a little—"you'll 
always be a sort ot goddess bless­
ing our hearth.”

Edith bent and kissed bcr. emo­
tion gripping her. "Your hearth Is 
blessed without m e." she said, "but 
I’ ll always be glad to com e."

subject arc already an integral p a r t ___________ ________________________
of Christian conduct as revealed in ? «  •*>.1  .  bum. tick bMilurlio »nd uDwla so iXwn c r a m  Drthe Word ot God. k m i noaudi rasktnt jrou _(o»l »ouf tan

I. Avoid Judgment (vv. 1-5).
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _  i n  i k i n g  y o u  ( m l

: sic* all o**r—JT’rtT ONE DOttE of IM U  
' gpwsdr tilicf. 23c ararywhorv.

Lost Wanderer
If any m an fancies that there 

is som e easier way of gaining a 
noL" obviously does not mean that dollar than by squarely earning 
we are not to exercise our God- it, he has lost the clue to his way 
given ability to discern between through this m ortal labyrinth, and 
good and evil, nor does it mean that must henceforth wander as chance 
we are to stand silent In the pres- m ay dictate.—H orace Greeley.
ence of wrongdoing. Verse 6 In ____________________________________ _
this very chapter calls for the use 
of Judgment (see also I Thess. 5:21). '

In all such Judgment we are to j  
avoid an unkind spirit and the hy­
pocrisy described in verses 3 to 5. <
We aro to be certain that our own 
lives are above reproach regnrding 
that which we condemn (v. 5). The 
none too common exercise of cor-

salutary twofold purpose of improv­
ing ourselves and of making us too 
busy to find fault with others.

II. Be Reverent (v. 0).
While we are not to Judge oth­

ers. we arc not to go to the opposite 
extreme of being so lenient In our 
attitude ihut we permit ungodly men 
to profane and trample down sacred

QUICK,WITH THIS FIRST-THOUGHT I 
AID FO R  HEAD COLDS'NASAL MISERIES 1 
PENETRO NOSE DR0PS--2 D R OPS-THt-Vj 
SOOTHE AS TH EY TOUCH THEY COOL A S f  
THEY VAPORIZE. THEY SHRINK AS T H E Y 1 
A CT-AN D  F R E S H -A IR  B R EA TH IN G  
IS F R E E R  A G A IN .

Creation of Idleness
It is idleness that creates im -Towne, riding like mad along the | things. This does not mean, as some j  f v ^ l h 1 l l » l i » « * * ' m i r i ^ h i » r ( » *  m e r T e e r w  Virginia roads, behind the compe-1 ___ 7. u______ ............................. ......... possibilities, and where m en care

tent Briggs, 
letter.

pondered over Jane’s

"I was not up-stalrs last night 
when you came. 1 was asleep in 
the window-scat of the living-room. 
Just off the porch. And your voice 
waked me and 1 heard what you | 
said, ond Mrs. Laramore. And I j 
can’ t marry you. I know how much 
you've done for me—and I shall 
never forget your goodness. Baldy 
will take me home.”

Enclosed was a pink check.
Towne blamed Adelaide furious- j  

ly. Of course It was her (nulL Such ! 
foolishness. And sentimentality. I 
And nc had been weak enough to 
fall for IL

YcL as he cooled a bit, he was 1 
glad that Jane had showed her re 
sentment. it was In keeping with | 
his conception ot her. Her Innocence | 
had tlamed against such sophistics- 
tion. There mtghL too, be a hint | 
of Jealousy. Women were like thaL 
Jealous.

As they whirled through Washing- j 
ton. Briggs voiced his fears. “ If we I 
meet a cop It will be all up with us, ; 
Mr. Townc."

"Take a chance. Briggs. Give j 
her more gas. We've got to g e t ' 
there."

With all their speed, however. It ! 
was four o'clock when they reached !

would have us believe, that we are not lQ do „  thing> shelter
not to present the gospel to the low- (Ujem seives under a persuasion 
est ot sinners; for example, to a lhat u  cannot bc d on c._ S o uth. 
drunkard. Only thus can such an :
Individual be saved. But it docs — “ — —— — — — —
mean that In dealing with holy j 
things wc are not only to be r e v - ; 
crent ourselves, but we are to be 
careful that we do not permit wick- j 
cd men to misuse and to profane ; 
the holy things of God.

III. Pray In Faith (vv. 7-11).
Here Is a straightforward prom- I 

Ise from the lips of our Lord Him­
self. assuring us that prayer will be | 
answered. It seems that He must > 
have foreknown that some would 
feel that the promise was too good 
to be true, so He stated it in three- | 
fold form and repeated It twice. Why j 
not believe IL act on IL and re­
ceive the answer?

Observe that there Is to bc lm- i 
portunity in prayer, wc arc to seek 
if wc would And. "Our Lord docs 
not guarantee to us anything at first 

| asking. God docs not open His trens- 
I ury to a passing bugle-call or the 

tap of a careless hand which Just 
touches the door and then passes 
on. Prayer is not a momentary wish 
or a transitory whim. It Is the ut­
terance of a confirmed and persist­
ent and unwearying longing. If you 
want a prayer answered, you must

/*------------------------\
'  Isn't This Why '

Yon Are Constipated?
What do you eat for breakfast? 
Coffee, toast, maybe some eggs? 
What do you eat for lunch nnd 
dinner? White bread, meat, pota­
toes? It'iUtUe wonder you're con­
stipated. You probably don't eat 
enough "bulk." And "bulk" 
doesn't mean tho amount you 
cat. It's n kind ot food that forms 
ft soft "bulky" mass In tho Intes­
tines and helps n movement. I f 
this Is your trouble, may we sug­
gest a crunchy toasted cereal— 
Kellogg’s All-Dran-tor breakfast. 
All-Brnn Is a natural food, not a 
medicine —but It's particularly 
rich In “ bulk.”  Being so. It con 
help you not only to get regular 
but to keep regular. You won't 
have to endure constipation, you 
can avoid IL Eat All-Bran dally, 
drink plenty of water, and llfo 
will be brighter tor you I Made by 
Kellogg's In Battle Creek.

A Loose Tongue
N ever yet did any man repent 

of having spoken too little, where-

Magic for Everyone Growing Fad in U. S.
SAN JOSE. CALIF.—If you see 

your neighbor lock his wife In a 
trunk and walk nonchalantly away, 
don't call the police.

Even If the neighbor returns with 
an armful of swords and begins 
stabbing the trunk In murderous 
frenzy, think twice before scream­
ing.

The chances are your neighbor Is 
merely one of the growing legion of 
Americans who fancies himself as 
a magician and lhat—like nine- 
tenths of them—he uses his wife as 
an osststanL

The Job Is a bit hard on the little 
woman. Owing partly to the Influ­
ence of the late Harry Houdlnl, 
the escape arlisL magic nowadays 
Involves being handcuffed, sewn up 
In a sack, locked into a medieval 
pillory, nailed up in n packing box 
or having one's head npparenlly 
lopped off by a guillotine.

A slender nnd good-looking girl 
may oven look forward to being 
sawed in half.

Magic has had Its followers os (nr 
back as history goes, but It has taken 
modern Industrial methods to put It 
In reach of everybody. The butcher 
or baker who wants to astound his 
friends at a Saturday night party 
can buy an Illusion, paraphernalia 
and Instructions, a* casually as he 
buys a package of clgarets.

From a playing card that changes 
Us spots to a big frame from which

go on praying" (J. G. Grccnhough).
Wi. hftvo lnrinriod thi. «rwaiir<i ns m any have been sorry that they 

S!’ " W00? :  ^ow ne ^ ^  sUU in the : GoIdcn Rulc undcr ^  iecUon be. have spoken too m uch.— Arabian
| cause the word "therefore”  links It Nights.
I with that which goca before. Dr. -------------------------------------—— -------------
I G. Campbell Morgan aptly aaya, “ If 

wc omit the 'therefore,* we cannot 
obey the vcrac. If we retain the 
‘therefore.’ and are driven to ask. 
to seek, to knock, and to know that 
the Listener to the nsklng, to the 
seeking, to the knocking, is our Fa­
ther, then the rule Is golden with 
heaven’ s own light, but in no other 
way.”

clothes he had worn on the links. 
He had not eaten since breakfast. 
He felt the strain.

He stormed up the terrace, where | 
once he had climbed In the snow. 
He rang the belL It whirred and 
whirred again In the silence. The 
house was empty.

(TO BE CONTINUED)

A wonderful ftld for both 
a drawing »Krot 

la Irxlifated. Soothing 
and comforting. Fin* for 
children and grown-up*. 
Practical Economical.

U l i M
a live horse disappears Into thin air ^  Goldcn Rulc , ,  rcally ^  fld
—everything’ s available. Hit pock 
etbook la the only UmlL 

It's a rare city that hasn’ t one or

fillmcnt of the law and the proph- 
eta, but In the light of Chrlit’a glo­
ry It la also a great principle of

more clubs where magicians meet | ,ovc and consideration,
frequently to sco and discuss the I
latest tricks.

A recent convention here of the j 
Pacific Coast Association of Magi- I 
clans attracted 300 persona. Dele-1 
gates stood In line to buy the latest 
Inventions.

The chief issue before maglcol so- | 
clctics is the exposure of tricks to ! 
flic general public. To magicians 
this breach of secrecy Is a crime 
comparable to manslaughter but 
since the government has not writ- j 
ten it Into the criminal code the 
worst penalty that can be inflicted 
Is ostracism by one's fellow per­
formers. *

Earliest Record of Coat 
The earliest historical record of | 

coal la lhat of Theophrastus, 300 
B. C., who says In his book on stones 
that coal is used by blacksmiths In 
Greece and Italy. The earliest men­
tion of coni in Englnnd was that 
made by the bishop of Durham, 1190 
A. D. Coal was mined In Belgium 
about 1200 A. D. In 1230 A. D. Hen­
ry III granted a license to mine 
coaL Coat was first shipped to Lon­
don In 1240. In 1300. the burning 
of coal In London was prohibited 
because ot the smoke.

IV. Walk In the Narrow Way (vv. 
13. 14).

The road to heaven is a narrow 
way because It is built to carry us 
through the quicksands of this world 
to a glorious consummation. It Is 
not a dismal road, for It 1* lighted 
by God's glory; and It la not a lone­
some road (even though few go that 
way), because Jesus walks with us.

The road to destruction Is broad. 
The entrance la easy; there is much 
company, but one soon finds that the 
company la distasteful—just fellow 
sinners. Jesus Is not going that way. 
The best people, God’ s people, arc 
going the other way. The rood lead* 
Into all kinds of by-wnys where pit- 
falls abound. The earthly pleas­
ures one thought to enjoy have, as 
Maclaren puts IL "a  strange knack 
of losing their charm and at the 
samo time Increasing their hold.”

Reward for Efforts
It never will rain roses; when 

we want to have m ore roses w e 
m ust plant m ore trees.—G eorge 
Eliot.

minty.
“W»-ow»" oul

Oo ftoi 
yovrwltl (

-•|#f1-ow»n" o u t o l t oytyvaoaftWt«oo!G«r
fl*M H o . Tltft fro gum* i»k» ol

In ) •  hwfct molt* o ftl»o«i»M»« 
•Sol looMm cllnolxa

holpf rolloyo tomtipolk*. 
tho m lS oroy. 

at d n ath o n .

Ek Writs for MNttOUS rtf! SMIPU I* 
V  Sort!oMTooCo,, Dopt.1-A.sklys,JtT.

Full of Grace
I will neither be content with what 

measure of grace 1 have, nor im­
patient of God’ s delay; but every 
day I will endeavor to have one drop 
added to the rest; so my last day 
■hall fill up my vessel to the brim.— 
Joseph Hall

MORE FOR YOPB M

o• Road the advertise me nta. 
They are more than a selling 
aid for business. Thoy form 
an educational system which 
is making Americans tho best- 
educated buyers in (he world. 
The advertisements are part 
of an economic system which 
la giving Americans more 
for their money every day.

N
E
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tree I JOHN Y. STANDIFEHPosey Paragraph prentice seaman before transfer to 

a ship o f the U. S. Fleet, or to one 
o f the Navy’s numerous trade 
schools.

Before enlistment at Dallas, Stan 
difer had made application and 
passed preliminary examinations 
at the U. S. Navy Recridting Sta- 
tion at Abilene. ' '

I At this writing ho is recovering. 
S The hit and run driver hus not 

been apprehended.

sheep. The meal is tho chief soul
of protein feed for cattlo and sheep. (TRANSFERRED TO CAD. 
Though not the best source of pro­
tein feed for hogs, yet It is used 
in mixtures with tankage ns a hog 
feed. Linters are used for making 
rayon, powder, puper and uphol­
stering.

There are about fifty different 
products made from tho cotton 
reed. From a ton of seed the mill 
will get about 300 pounds of oil,
9̂00 pounds of cake, 125 pounds of 
lint, 515 pounds of hulls and 100 
pounds of waste. No one enn fully 
appreciate this industry without a 
trip through the plant.

school house Friday and reorgan- Inspection Tour 
ized.

The next W.M.S. meeting is to be .' Fourteen local Future Farmers 
with Mrs. Carl Miller November J accompanied by the Chapter Advls- 
23rd. We hope all members will bo *er and six students from the Texas 
present. A week of prayer program Technological college mude an ip- 
la to bo conducted that day. spection tour of the West Texas

Robert iBoyco, Gerald Clifton, Cotton Oil Company plant of Sla- 
Pote Starke, and Harvey Carroll ton on Wednesday afternoon, Nov. 
left Tuesday for Marfa on a deer 8th.
hunt. The seed house and the machin-

Terry Clifton, Warner Boyce and ery to convey tho seed from whoro 
Elmer Fincher motored to Morton they aro first unlondcd into the 
Saturday, on business. mill wns first visited. One dump pit

■ ------ - receives the seed grown in fields
, not infected with Pink Boll Worms 

The General Missionary Society wbj|0 the other receives seed from 
of the First Methodist Church will infcctcd area8 Thc |nfectci| 8eod
hnvc their next mooting Monday arc run through steam to kill all 
afternoon at 3 o clock. The program Larva, eggs and adult flies that 
on the year-book will be studied, mny be pri58Cnt nJld thcn into thc 
and Mrs. J. D. Holt \V ill be in good j10UgCi The 8CClj nre carried 
charge. All members are invited from tho 8torc room through thc 

attend, gins to remove the lint. There nre
two grades of linters taken from

Mr. nnd Mrs. W. L. Johns re- tho 8ccd- From tho Kin houso thc 
turned Wednesday night from n Bccd nrc conveyed to tho crusher 
two-weeks vacation nnd business nnd aftcr tho hulls arc 8eParated 
trip. They stopped in Dallas, Paris, from the ,ncat or kern('1 thc Iattor 
Whitewright and points in south- l’ roduc‘  is taken to tho cookln* vat> 
cm Oklahoma, before returning thence In to the press where the oil 
bome is removed and drnwn o ff into stor-

______  age tanks. The hulls aro conveyed
to the bin where they nre sold to 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Macklin of retail trade or loaded for shipment 
Grove, Oklnhoma, who moved to to distant points.
Slaton recently, will manage Cotton seed meal is one of the 
thc Modern Inn, which hns opened main products put out by thc mill, 
up under new management. Mrs. It is put up ns meal or nuggets. 
Macklin is thc sister of Mrs. Felix Thc nuggets are of two sizes, one 
Boldin. size for cattle and the other for

Mrs. S. N. Gentry, Correspondent
PICKETT-llOIlBS WEDDING 

Mr. Burley Pickett was mnrried 
Thursday of last week to firs. Mol- 
lic Hobbs of Wagner, Oklahoma. 
The couple will be at homo near 
Posey.

HIT AND RUN DRIVER
returning 

Mt week, driving 
itor from the re-

Marviit .(jehert was 
from | f
h|s fat|;pt^;lrd 
PAir#hoK t*fw.« 
tractor
\>scy. oveyturne 
ped awaypwithout.atapping. Young 

Gebcrt w.ia iriekod up by passing 
motorists ilopte time Inter suffer­
ing a broken tug and other injuries.

Job Printing Neatly fjfne.
POSBY W.M.S.

Tho Posoy W.M.S. wns guest of 
the Canyon W.M.S. Monday. Those 

Mcsdamcs 0 . R.
SPECIAL— LIMITED TIME ONtT

attending were,
Patterson, Benton Patterson, Elmer 

HoraceFincher, Cecil Davidson,
Rodgers, S. N. Gentry, J. M. Mor­
rison, Jess Shafer, T. A. Johnson, 
E. C. Cliffton, Grandma Rodgers, 
Miss Emma I.a mb nnd Miss Lorcnc 
Gentry.

Mr. and Mrs. O. D. McClintock 
and daughter, Mias Lorcne, spent 
the week-end in Wichita Falls 
visiting Mrs. McClintock’s mother 
and sister.Mr. and Mrs. Marcus Bums of 

Spur were guests in tho homo of 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. E. 
Burns, Friday night.

Mr. and Mrs. George W. James 
of Levcliand were visitors in the 
home of her parents, Mr. nnd Mrs. 
A. B. Cloningcr, last week.

Mr. and Mrs. A. M. Carroll nnd 
Mr. and Mrs. Jay Carroll and son, 
Joe, spent Saturday night and Sun 
day visiting in the homes of Mr. 
A. S. Carroll, nnd Mr. nnd Mrs. J. 
W. Becman of Paducah.

Mrs. Rilln Box of Los Angeles, 
California, nnd Mr. and Mrs. Mays 

•ere visitors in the

Sweaters, 
Ladies Dresses

Christmas 
Novelties 

If it is new you

of Amarillo, 
home of Mr. nnd Mrs. J. M. Morri­
son, Sunday. Grandmn Rodgers had 
been with thc Mays for a long visit 
and returned home with them. We 
arc glad to have Grandma back 
with us again.

Mr. and Mrs. C. F. Lawson of 
Hurlwood were visitors in the 
Posey Community last week.

Mr .and Mrs. M. P. Gentry visi­
ted Mr. and Mrs. Bert Darlnnd of 
the Morton Community last week.

Miss Winona Campbell from Pet­
ersburg spent the week-end with 
Miss Mary Frances Cloninger.

Mr. and Mrs. R. S. Bagby, who 
are moving to Post, stopped for n 
short visit with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Fincher, this week.

Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Johnson and 
son, Elmer, and Mrs. P. L. Johnson 
and daughter of Levelland visited 
in the home of Mr. nnd Mrs. S. N. 
Gentry Sunday. Lorcnc returned 
home with them after a two weeks

Your baby's very own show 
not a replica, but tbs 

shoes themselves— preserved 
r and finished In a beautiful 

metallic bronze finish.
Use unmounted as a paper- 
'weight, ornament, etc. $149 

v or mounted on Ivory and 
gold-trimm ed book-ends.

Come Jiero daily for fresh baked
' • •» l Li ,
breads, rolls, cakes, pies nnd pas 

’ tries of all kinds and make 

YOUR cooking task easier—as 

.so MANY'  WISE housewives 

larc doing Our low prices make 

this plait a 4rue economy.
PROTEIN

YOU NEED
PROTEIN

YOU GET

SlafOnBaking
THfutMT emcr STo»r Use our lay-away plan. A  small deposit will

hold any article’until Christmas 
PAY 50c WEEKLY atReady-to-Wear

Texas Ave. & 8th St,Deal's Machine Shop 
And Garage

All Kind* o f Machine Work 
. Welding, ReUdtihg 

155 N. Ninth Slaton

To balance your farm grains and 
roughages in livestock rations, you 
must have an adequate supply of PRO­
TEIN.

Cottonseed Meal, or Cake, contains 
PROTEIN in a concentrated, economi­
cal and efficient form. A ton of Meal 
or Cake contains about TWICE as 
much digestible protein as a ton of 
Cottonseed.

DON’T HURRY 
Just come in 

today for
PORTRAITS 

The most personal 
of Christmas 

gifts
Artcraft Studio

GRAPEFRUIT Texas Seedless 4 for
ORANGES full of juice nice size each 
BANANAS golden fruit 2 dozen 
CARROTS nice size bunches 2 for

Grace White,
, Director

Slaton, TexasBoard
’Cmirsc* offered in

(KINWT1CS. DICTION, 
.ij^TRItl’ RETATlON,

PUlli.Yc SPEAKING CHERRIES gallon Red, sour, pitte 
PUMPKIN Kuriers fancy No. 2 can 
SPINACH No. 2 can Red & White 2 
PEARS No. 2Vi can Heavy Syrup 2 for
PICKLES full quart Sour 
CORNFLAKES
PALM OLIVE SOAP 3 bars 
TOILET TISSUE Blu-Kross 3 rolls 
COFFEE Red& White l t b  ca n ________

TOMATO JUICE R&W 12 oz cans 3 for 
SWANKS DOWN Cake Flour reg. pkg.

Market Specials
SLICED BACON Arm per 16
PORK ROAST nice lean cuts 16 
BEEF ROAST any cat fore quarter 
CHEESE Kraft 216 boxes

SLATON CLASSES 
W 'l 'u V K , Wednesdays, Fridays 
Ml |WHt. vVhiTdj Junior High and 
y il 'I V'rEopf6r High.

lY  jAUo, teach Wednesday at 
lj\ i\yJut jWit'rd Music Studio 
a pre-school students

offering instruction in rythtn, 
i t  ( m e ]  j ^ o n o t i c H  and personality 
1 j ' ! i I , <Tevelopment. 10-to 50 per cent off 

on EVERYTHING
Personal Loans

Special'Rates To
Railroad Men

AND
School Teachers

ALL. TranimcUmui Confidential

ACE, FINANCE CO.
SOT OonJcy Building 

UMmcfc Phone 3267
-...P-YWJIuk Clothier*

d tV iiW a ft so. 11th

Everything on sale Every item is a bargain
Seeing is believing. Come in and let us SHOW YOU

We have plenty of Dressed Hens, Turkeys, Fryers-Also fresh 
Fish and Oysters.

\
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