
American Legion Plans 
Free Dinner February 25 

The Rising Star American 
Legion is resuming it's past 
tradition of holding barbecue 
dinners open to the com-
munity. 

The barbecue dinner will 
be Saturday, February 25 at 

the American Legion Hall. 
Serving begins at 5:00 p.m. 
and the dinner is free to the 
public. 

Post Commander Kenny 
Rutledge extends an invita-
tion to everyone in the Rising 
Star area to attend. 

ty of the Rising Star 
Livestock raisers. Fifty per-
cent of profit raised from the 
to the organization-
designated by the person 
who enters the food. 

Official entry forms are 
available at The Rising Star 
office, from any 4-H, FFA, or 
FHA member. They may 
also be found in this issue of 
the newspaper. 

Saturday, February 18 

Market Building 

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS 

8:00 Begin taking entries 
9:00 All entries must be in place 

11:00 Lunch begins 
1:00 Auction of food items 
2:00 Pig show 
2:30 Lamb show 

3rd MONDAY 
EMS Volunteers 

3rd TUESDAY 
BIRTHDAY PARTY, R.S. 
Nursing Center 

3rd THURSDAY 
SCOTTISH RITE 

3RD FRIDAY 
LADIES LUNCHEON, 
Lakewood 

EACH THURSDAY 
SENIOR CITIZENS 

EACH SATURDAY 
BINGO, American Legion 
Hall 

MAY COMMUNITY SING-
ING 

The First Baptist Church 
of May will sponsor an all 
community singing at 7 p.m. 
Wednesday, February 22. 

Everyone is invited. 

CHAMBER AWARDS BAN-
QUET 

The annual awards ban-
quet held by the Rising Star 
Chamber of Coirunerce & 

I PHOTOGRAPHY 
Nature 	CLOTHING 

I Scenic 
People 

I General 

FOODS 
Cookies 

I Pies 
Candy 
Quick breads 
Yeast breads 

I Cakes 
▪ Decorated cakes 
I Canned foods 
▪ Jams, jellies, preserves 

Day-time 
Sports 
Formal (after 5) 
Misc. 

ARTS & CRAFTS 
Ceramics 
Toys & dolls 
Woodworking 
Metal working 
Misc. 

NEEDLEWORK 
Knitting 
Crochet 
Afghans 
Quilts 
Handstitchery 

ART 
Oil 
Acrylic 
Watercolor 
Crayola 
Markers 
Misc. 
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Nominees for 
Awards Sought 

by Chamber 
The Board of Directors for 

the Rising Star Chamber of 
Commerce & Agriculture is 
asking for nominations for 
recipients of the annual 
awards. Let one of the 
members know your choice 
for outstanding business per-
son, farmer and family. 

Secretary for the Chamber 
is Jean Bryan, 643-3215 or 
643-2717. Board members in-
clude Lottie Mae Roach, 
Gene Hicks, Frank Agnew, 
Gene Lyon, Pat Byrom, Bar-
bara Kanady, Sue Landess, 
Evelynn Donham, Dr. 
Donald Bryan, Gene Moore 
and Carolyn Ratliff. 

4-Hers Sell 
Light Bulbs 

The Rising Star 4-H Club 
are now selling Revere light 
bulbs, 2 for $1.50 with a 3 
year guarantee. All money 
raised goes to the 4-H Club 
activities and Rising Star 
County Livestock Show. 

Am hu la n ce 
Donations 

Ambulance fund donations 
and memorials made since 
December are listed below. 

Memorials have been 
received for Mary Conkling, 
Ted Tharp, Nick Nichols, 
C.D. Lovell, Dewie 
Chambers, Edgar Boyd, and 
Terry Henry. 

Donations have been made 
by John and Geneva Cooper, 
Mrs. D. Breeding. Rising 
Star Nursing Center, D. Har-
dy, James Smith, Maxine 
Bowden, Ladell Key, Ivy 
Allen, Maxine Robinson, Col-
onial Oaks Nursing Home, 
May 	Extension 
Homemakers Club, Mr. and 
Mrs. Victor Childers, Satur-
day Club, Mrs. R.D. Brown, 
Mrs. Alice Tharp, James R. 
Johnson, May Pearl Hull, 
Elgie and Maxine Crisp, 
Mrs. Billy Carpenter, Mr. 
and Mrs. R.H. Erwin, 
Weldon Hill, Mrs. Bob 
Smith, J.H. Whiteside, 
Robert Bivens, Mr. and Mrs. 
W.H. May, Kay Barker, Mr. 
and Mrs. E.G. Henry, Leona 
Brigner, Mr. and Mrs. 
Luther Swift and Herman 
and Jimmie Claborn. 

If your name has been 
omitted from the list, please 
call 643-4572. 

County Commissioners Areawide Meeting 
Set for March 2 

Rising Star Annual Livestock 

Show & Fair Is February 18 
and Georgia Hunter spoke for 
the group, telling of a narrow 
and dangerous stretch of dirt 
road about 1'/2  miles long near 
the Lake. 

Norman Christian, Com- 

missioner of Pct., 	agreed 
with the statements as to the 
condition of the road, and said 
fixing this roadway was top 
priority in his schedule. He 
mentioned some of the diffi-
culty in working on road in 
this area, where rain or an 
overflow from the lake could 
hinder large machinery. 

The citizens seemed to 
agree that all the conditions 
that were notChristian's fault. 
They mentioned some large 
mesquite bushes growing in 
the bar ditches - showing that 
the ditches hadn't been 
cleared out there for many 
years. 

In other road-related mat-
ters, citizens told the Com-
missioners of trouble with 
access to Center Point Ceme-
tery, in Pct. 3 south of Car-
bon. Reportedly there is just 
one way into the Cemetery at 
present, on the south side. 
Comm issioner L.T. Owen put 
a cattle guard on the north 
side and someone placed a 
gate across it. 

Information on a plat which 
will apparently be sub-di-
vided was presented to the 
Commissioners by Dick 
Johnson. This 27.7 acres is in 
SE/4 of Sect. 94, Block 3, 
H&TC, A-1378, Eastland 
County. It lies off Highway 
206 just southeast of the 
Nimrod Community. 

The motion was made and 
approved to accept the plat, 
with the stipulation that the 
county not accept any obliga-
tion to build or maintain roads 
in the development. 

guide with detailed goals so 
that we can work toward a 
brighter future for Rising 
Star and the area. 

A commitment from the 
community and the energy 
of its' citizens will be 
necessary to achieve such 
goals. 

More information will be 
released at a later date. 

ne Eastland County 
Commissioners Court had a 
full house for their meeting 
on Monday, Feb. 13. Tax 
collection lawyers, bankers, 
citizens with road problems, 
State Highway officials and 
others were present. At times 
they listened and at other 
times participated in the 
lengthy discussions morning 
and afternoon. 

One of the first items on the 
agenda concerned the award-
ing of bids for the County 
Depository and Trust Funds 
for the District and County 
Clerks. 

The Commissioners voted 
to place the County Clerk's 
account and trust funds with 
Olney Savings, under the 
condition of their bid. First 
National Bank of Cisco will 
serve as the County's Deposi-
tory, and Eastland National 
Bank will hold the District 
Clerk's accounts and trust 
funds. 

On another matter, the 
Commissioners decided to 
continue the contract with 
Pritchard & Abbot, Inc. for 
On-Line Tax Collection serv-
ices. Attorney Jim Pritchard 
spoke to the Court, telling of 
alternate plans to up-date the 
service. 

County Judge Scott Bailey 
questioned Pritchard as to 
why taxes due years ago 
would now show up en state-
ments, with firms and indi-
viduals saying they were 
never informed in the year 
the taxes were due. 

Pritchard said this was an 
"Unfortunate situation," and 
listed several possible causes. 

The Commissioners said 
they were presently under a 
contract with the Austin Tax 
Collection firm of McCreary, 
Veselka, Beck and Allen to 
collect delinquent taxes for 
the County and would honor 
this. Representatives of this 
firm were in the courtroom, 
and described their activities 
in searching out delinquen-
cies and collecting. 

Elliot Beck said the firm 
had mailed out 10,605 letters 
during the past year, filed 119 
suits, and collected $87,762 
for the county. 

During the morning a 
number of citizens appeared 
before the Commissioners to 

• ask for improvement to a 
stretch of road on the South 
side of Lake Leon. Earl Trout 

The Rising Star Annual 
Livestock Show and Fair will 
be Saturday, February 18 
beginning at 11:00 a.m. The 
food auction will begin at 1 
p.m. followed by the pig 
show at 2:00 and lamb show 
at 2:30. 

Classes are: 
Sub-junior - preschool 

through 3rd grade; Junior-
4th grade through 8th grade; 
Senior- 9th through 12th 
grade; and Adult. 

Departments are: 
ART- oil, acrylic, water-

colors, crayola, markers, 
misc. 

PHOTO- native, scenic, 
people, general. 

NEEDLEWORK- knitting, 
crochet, afghans, quilts, 
handstitchery. 

ARTS AND CRAFTS-
ceramics, toys and dolls, 
woodworking, metal work-
ing, misc. 

CLOTHING- day-time, 
sports, formal (after 5), 
misc. 

FOODS- cookies, pies, can-
dy, quick breads, yeast 
breads, cakes, decorated 
cakes, canned foods, jams 
(jellies, preserves). 

There will be a champion 
and reserve champion for 
each department and high-
point plaques for each class. 

Here are a few reminders 
on rules and regulations for 
fair entries. 
(1) Recipes must be placed 
with entries. No mixes will 
be allowed except for 
decorated cakes. 
(2) Entries should be placed 
on a disposable plate and 
have a plastic cover. 
(3) Cookie entries will be 
made up of two dozen. 
(4) All foods become proper- 

ev. WILDCAT TALES 

To Support Our Youth  

Plan to Eat BBQ, Beans 
at Livestock Show & Fair 

RISING STAR HIGH 
JOURNAL'S/4 

An area-wide meeting will 
be held March 2 at 6 p.m. at 
the First Baptist Church ac-
tivity center. 

Julia Moke with the 
Department of Commerce in 
Austin will speak on a 
"Blueprint for Tomorrow." 
The survival of Rising Star 
may depend on your atten-
dance at this program. With 
this help, we can plan a 

Picture this. It is Satur-
day, February 18, around 
noon. Your tummy is beginn-
ing to growl and you ate your 
last Snickers bar this morn-
ing for breakfast. You really 
don't feel like cooking. So 
what are you going to do? 

Here's the answer to the 
million dollar question; You 
are going to the Rising Star 
livestock Show & Fair and 

support the youth of Rising 
Star! You will get beans and 
cornbread and/or barbeque 
to satisfy that rather large 
hunger you've developed. 

Don't forget now, barbe-
que and/or beans and corn-
bread at the local show and 
fair. 

See y'all there. 
Steliheiire Long 

The Wildcats' final basket-
ball game of the season was 
played at Lingleville in a 
make-up game Friday. The 
final score was Rising Star 
32, Lingleville 61. High 
scorer for the game was 
Steve Wilson with 10 points, 
Derrick White had 6, Reil 
Barron and Toby Long had 4 
each and Shawn Morrow, 
Shannon Bailey, Lee DeLong 
and Jimmy Evans had 2 
points each. 

Cody Wilson and Johnny 
House 

LITTLE LADY CATS 
The Lady Cats played 

their last game of the season 
at May last week, just miss-
ing a victory over the May 
team. 

This was Coach Judy Hin-
nant's first year to teach 
here and I thought she did a 
fabulous job coaching this 
group of girls. Team 
members showed superb 
teamwork and school spirit 
this year. 

Little Lady Cat team 
members are 8th graders Jo 
Linney and Shawna Waddle; 
7th graders Rebecca Col-
eman, Christy Hughes, Lisa 
Robinette, Emily Stuteville, 
Inga Williams and Heather 
Wright; and 6th graders 
Misti Bailey, Andrea Fox, 
Brandi Harris, Gwen Hollis, 
Heather Hutchinson and 
Olivia West. 

Congratulations to Coach 
Hinnant and the Lady Cats 
on a great first season 
together! 

Gherda Williams 

JR. WILDCATS 
In my last article I made a 

mistake saying if the Cats 
lost to May they would tie 
with Gorman for District 
championship. The truth is, 
when the Cats lost to May 
they fell behind the Gorman 
team, which had only one 
district loss; Rising Star had 
two. Nevertheless, we con-
gratulate the Jr. Cats for 
achieving second place in 
District. 

Playing less than their 
best, the Cats scored two 
quick baskets hut May 
whizzed past them for a 
score of Rising Star 6, May 7 
at the end of the first 
quarter. 

The Wildcats played much 
better the second quarter, 
nipping May's heels on scor-
ing. The halftime score was 
Rising Star 22, May 25. 

May pulled ahead during 
the second half and the final 
score was Rising Star 36, 
May 47. 

Robert Self led the scoring 
with 13 points; Horton had 7; 
Chris Eddington and Chris 
DeLong each had 5; Will 
Ezzell, Terry Ware and 
Duane Schwab scored 2 point 
each. 	Roane!! Barron 

RS School Attendance 
Check Begins Monday 

LADY CATS 
The Lady Cats went to 

May last Tuesday for an im-
portant match: a win would 
assure the Ladies a spot in 
the playoffs and a loss woulo 
mean a rematch with Gor 
man for second place in 
bistrict. After a very evenly 
matched game with a back-
and-forth score, the Queens 
of the Court reigned with a 37 
to 32 win. 

Proving great things come 
in small packages, leader of 
the pack Shannon Stuteville 
was high point scorer with 10 
points. Sometimes overlook-
ed (she's 4 ft. 113/4  in. tall), 
Shannon is a strong, steady 
player who has very few tur-
novers. She's has been an 
asset to the Ladies. 

Following close on her 
heels were Stacey Wright 
and Wendy Green with 8 
points each, Shauna Harmon 
had 5, Jomy Clark had 4 and 
Stephanie Long had 2 points. 

Way to go Ladies, your 
fans are proud of you! State, 
here we come. 

Sandy Wright 
(Reporting about a modest 

Shannon) 

QUEENS OF THE COURT 
After being assured of a 

playoff f spot with their 37-22 
victory over May last Tues-
day, the Lady Cats came out 
fired up and ready to play 
against Lingleville last 
Thursday night. The Ladies 
played well, making a major 
improvement over their 
previous game with the team 
that is now District cham-
pion. The final score was 
Rising Star 43, Lingleville 64. 

High point player for the 
game was Senior Stacey 
Wright with 18; Wendy 
Green had 11, Stephanie 
Long 7, Jotny Clark 4, 
Shawna Harmon 2 and Pam 
Hollis had 1. 

The District record for the 
Lady Cats now stands at 7-3. 
Way to go, Ladies! 

The Bi-District Playoff 
Game will be against Cross 
Plains at the Brownwood 
Coliseum Friday, February 
17, at 6:30 p.m. Come out and 
cheer the Lady Cats on to 
victory!!! 

Good luck, Ladies!!! 
Shannon Stuteville 

The Texas Education 
Agency gives the school two 
times during the year for 
checking the students' 
average daily attendance. 
The first one was during the 
fall and the spring check will 
be Monday, February 20 and 
run through March 17. The 
attendance of your children 
during this time will deter-
mine how much money the 
school will receive from the 
state to help our education 
program for the school year 
1988-89. 

Rules from the State 
Board of Education require 
that an attendance roll be 
taken during a designated 
period each day. The Rising 

Star Independent School 
District has designated and 
period of the school day, 
from 9:00 a.m. to 10:00 a.m. 
as the time roll to be check-
ed. Students present at that 
time are to be recorded pre-
sent all day and students ab-
sent at that time are to be 
recorded absent all day. 

On behalf of the Rising 
Star I.S.D., we encourage 
and stress the importance of 
having your children here, if 
at all possible, during the 
and period for the next four 
weeks. 

Thanks for your help. 
Weldon Hill 

Robby Stuteville 
Donald E. Bryan 

Menu 
FEB. 20-24 

MONDAY 
Lunch: Tamale pie, mixed 
vegetables, cake, milk 
Breakfast: Biscuits, gravy, 
juice, milk 

TUESDAY 
Lunch: Shepherd's pie, 
salad, carrots, jello, rolls, 
milk 
Breakfast: Sausage, eggs, 
toast, juice, milk 

WEDNESDAY 
Lunch: Chili beans, okra, 
cornbread, cobbler, milk 
Breakfast: Toast, bacon, 
fruit, milk 

THURSDAY 
Lunch: Tostados, refried 
beans, salad, fruit, milk 
Breakfast: Pancakes, syrup, 
juice, milk 

FRIDAY 
Lunch: Hot dogs, relish, 
pickles, onions, French fries, 
cookies, milk 
Breakfast: 	Biscuits, 
sausage, gravy juice, milk 

community calendar... 

Weather 
Rising Star received one 

tenth inch of mist, drizzle 
and light rain Sunday. A 
lesser amount of mist and 
drizzle accumulated Tues-
day. 

The omen for an April 
freeze rumbled across Ris-
ing Star about 2 a.m. 
Wednesday, the second 
thunderstorm the area has 
had this month. One inch of 
rainfall was reported; a 
possibility of more rain and 
colder weather was in the 
forecast. 

Boostere 
Say Thanks 

I would like to give a 
special "Thank You" to all 
the mothers who helped in 
the basketball concession 
stand this season. 

Thanks again! We couldn't 
do this without your help. 

Debbie White 
Pres. Booster Club 

• 41I••• MM. moo . 
Agriculture will be Thurs-
day, March 16, at 7 p.m. at 
the Activity Center of First 
Baptist Church. Tickets are 
$8.50 each and the meal will 
be catered by Cook's Fish 
Barn. 

Public speaker for the 
Dallas Cowboys, Ray Stone, 
will entertain banquet goers 
with a humorous talk about 
the Cowboys. 

Tickets are available at 
many local businesses. 

SIGNED FOOTBALL 
A football with signatures 

of 10 Dallas Cowboys will be 
given away by the Rising 
Star Chamber of Commerce 
& Agriculture. Look for 
tickets of opportunity at 
most business places here. 

School Calendar 
Thursday, February 16-18 

Pee Wee Basketball 
Tourney, Sidney 

Friday, February 17 
Bi-District Playoff Girls 
Basketball, Rising Star vs 
Cross Plains, 6:30 p.m. 
Brownwnod Coliseum 

Saturday, February 18 
Local livestock show, 11 a.m. 

Fair Entry Form I 

food clonal 

Livestock 
I 

'Circle one organization to which 
ition goes to: 

F.H.A., Senior Citizens, 
Raiser's Association. 
NAME 	  
ICLASS 	  
`DEPT. 	  
'Classes: 
(Preschool thru 3rd) 
(4th thru 8th) 

1(9th thru 12th) 

• • 	• 
iisetae ; 

• 

4teataatha-iaL 	 cl:k • .^: • 	• • -• 

Th e Footballwith,rovii,• -.., 	on A  a  -.at 	• 4!,. 	3  P? 1.. 
Signatures of Dallas Cowboys 

tn.; rIE:jak2:""22the Post :0ificc e7157:  
This Week 

-Subjunior 
--Junior 
--Senior 
--Adult I 

I 

I 
I 

I 

I 

I 

I 

I 

I 

Palace Drug Store 
Will Be Closed 

All Day 
This Saturday Only 

February 18 
RS7 

WILDCATS TAKE TO THE 
COURT 

The Wildcats hit the court 
at May last Tuesday night, 
racking up a final score of 38 
to May's 40. High scorer was 
Steve Wilson with 11 points; 
Derrick White had 7, Jimmy 
Evans and Reil Barron had 6 
each, Howard Lawrence 3, 
Shawn Morrow and Shannon 
Bailey 2 each and Toby Long 
had 1. 



Stop In It See Our Selections 

Grapevine Wreaths 
Art Supplies 

Paintings 
Gifts 

Hubbard Gift & Gallery 
Rising Star 	 817443-6242 

__as00001 WHY WAIT 
ISO tan  0 FOR YOUR 

Vio
tti 'Poo TAX REFUND 

WHEN YOU CAN 
GET YOUR MONEY FAST! 

USE H&R BLOCK'S RAPID REFUND PROGRAM 
It's a load against your expected 
federal Income tax'refuncL Available 
whether H&R Block prepares your 
tax return or not. 

IT'S FAST! H&R BLOCK 

KFor more details or to see if you quality call MR Block now. 
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Commodities Distribution ies The Saturday Club Senior Center News HAPPY 
BIRTHDAY 

Ihn.  Whiteside 

ct:( )ss 	- Sur. tes 
.1!ones Whitesidi 

triiss Plains sit. ,,hull a Ili 
a.1:1. Saturday at 1-lit.;01- 
Wiliam Funeral !Mime with 
Allen Whisesule officiating. 
Burial was in Sipe Springs 
Ceme7ery in Comanche 
County. He died at 12:45 a.m. 
Thursday. February 9 at a 
Rising Star nursing home. 

He was born September 1, 
1906, in Sipe Springs. On Oc-
tober 1. 1927, he married 
Mamie Hicks in Bastrop. In 
the oil business and a ran-
cher, he was a member of 
the Church of Christ. 

Survivors include his wife; 
two sons, John Whiteside of 
Midland and Jerry 
Whiteside of Beaumont; a 
daughter, Mary Hogan of 
Tyler; 10 grandchildren: 
and 15 great-grandchildren. 

USE THE 
CLASSIFIEDS 

are: Butter, corn meal, canned 
pork, peanut butter, vegetar-
ian beans. 

CTO has no control over 
what items are available or 
the quantity of the items. 
Allocation of all commodi-

ties depends on the availabil-
ity of food items from the 
USDA. 

All eligible persons will 
receive emergency food as-
sistance without regard to 
race,sex,politicalbeliefs,age, 
national origin, or handicap. 
Shutins are encouraged to 
designate an authorized rep-
resentative to pick up for 
them. Commodities will be 
distributed on a first come/ 
first serve basis. Volunteers 

are greatly needed and appre-
ciated. Clients are urged to 
bring a sack when picking up 
their commodities. 

Central Texas Opportuni-
ties, Inc. will distribute USDA 
Commodities in Eastland 
County at the following sites: 

Cisco - Gaslite Apts. Tues-
day, Feb. 21, 1989 8:00 a.m. 
to 10:00 a.m. 

Rising Star - Sr. Citz. Ctr. 
Tuesday, Feb. 21, 1989 1:00 
p.m. to 2:30 p.m. 

Eastland - Sr. Citz. Ctr. 
Wednesday, Feb. 22, 1989 
8:00 a.m. to 10:00 a.m. 

Carbon-Downtown-
Wednesday, Feb. 22, 1989 
11:30 a.m. to 12:00 noon. 

Gorman-Sr. Citz. Ctr. 
Wednesday, Feb. 22, 
19891:00 p.m. to 2:00 p.m. 

Desdemona-School-
Wednesday, Feb. 22, 1989 

2:30 p.m. to 3:00 p.m. 
Ranger-Sr.Citz.Ctr. Thurs-

day, Feb. 23, 1989 8:00 a.m. 
to 10:00 a.m. 

Items available this month 

Our monthly birthday par-
ty will be February 21 at 
2:30. 

Martha Irby's visitor was 
Carlene Nichols. 
was referred to Dr. Kelly in 
Brownwood for an examina-
tion. 

inrory Arer-r-4,---,  

ing better after a round with 
pneumonia. 

Leroy and Marguerite Liv-
ingston were at the club 
Thursday. Among food 
Marguerite brought was her 
favorite chocolate cake, 
which was enjoyed by us 
chocolate eating people, 

Marion and Marjorie West 
enjoyed Wednesday visiting 
their friends at Cisco Senior 
Citizens Center. 

Edith Bostick spent Satur-
day with her son, Kenneth, 
and family. They enjoyed a 
belated birthday cake for 
Edith. 

Willie Lee Maynard and 
Edith Bostick were shopping 
in Brownwood Tuesday. 
This Thursday, February 

16, Dr. Charles Barnes will 
bring a program. Please 
plan to come to Senior 
Citizens at noon. He will give 
program immediately after 
lunch. Thursdays are 
covered dish luncheon, ex-
cept this Thursday will be a 
special "Pile On Dinner". 

By Marjorie West 

Maxine Robertson \v.,: 
voted to be reinAtated as a 
member of the Saturday 
Club. 

Irene Mayfield made an 
announcement that Julia 
Menke from the Department 
of Commerce will come to 
Rising Star and speak on 
-Community Plan for Im-
provement". This will be 
March 2 at 6 p.m. The place 
will be announced. 

Linda Lancaster talked 
briefly on the "Spring Roun-
dup," an extension event for 
people over 55 years of age 
held at the Texas 4-H Center 
near Lake Browmvood. If in-
terested, see Linda for the 
dates and cost. 

Linda gave an interesting 
demonstration on wonder-
under fun shirts. She used 
silk flowers on a sweat shirt 
and applied glitter paint 
around the edges of the 
flowers. Club members 
couldn't wait to buy the 
materials to make a pretty 
shirt. 

Red and white were 
predominant in the decora-
tions. Pretty teddy bears 
were displayed on the tables. 
Refreshments were served 
from a table carrying the 
Valentine theme. Helen 
Donham assisted the 
hostesses in serving 
delicious refreshments. 

saturday Club met in 
the City Library with a pro-
gram and business meeting 
February 1, 

Liz Hardy and Linda Lan-
caster served as program 
and hostess coordinators. 

Dicie Adams, club presi-
dent, opened the meeting. 
Joyce Geye gave the invoca-
tion and club members said 
the Pledge of Allegiance in 
unison. Dororthy Shook call-
ed the roll and read the 
minutes of the previous 
meeting. Blanche Cawley 
read the treasurer's report. 

Thank you notes were read 
by corresponding secretary, 
Linda Lancaster. Elizabeth 
Robertson was voted to be 
placed as an honorary 
member of the club. 

Beatrice Kruger, Polly 
Price and Emma Jean Steel 
volunteered to attend a 
workshop meeting in Com-
anche for the District 
meeting which will be in 
Brownwood March 24 and 25. 

Pauline Hudson gave a 
report on the smoke film 
placed on the windows of the 
meeting room. The club 
voted to have the correspon-
ding secretary send Joe 
Campbell a thank you note 
for putting the smoke film on 
the windows. 

The club voted to give the 
Ambulance Fund $100.00. 

The Senior Citizens en-
joyed a good day at the 
center Thursday. Everyone 
enjoyed a delicious covered 
dish luncheon. 

Bob Beavers, Loveta 
Beavers and Geneva King, 
from Cisco were guests. 

Bob has been conducting a 
"55 Alive" driving course, 
February 7 and 9. Thirty-
four people took the course. 
Loveta Beavers did the book 
work for the course. 

Evelyn Ward checked 
blood pressure at the center 
Thursday. The club ap-
preciate Evelyn for taking 
time to do this service for the 
club. 

Thursday, February 16 we 
will have a "Pile On Lun-
cheon". Make your plans to 
be here for lunch, it will be a 
treat for you. 

On Thursday, February 
23, we will have a birthday 
luncheon honoring those who 
have a birthday in February. 

Tuesday, February 21, the 
commodities will be issued 
from 1:00 to 2:30 p.m. 

Artie Jaggers has been 
sick. We hope she will be 
feeling much better soon. We 
miss her presence at the 
center. 

Marion and Marjorie West 
spent seven days in Fort 
Worth with Marjorie's 
sister, Lucille Stillwell. They 
were house bound by ice. 
Watching T.V. and dominoes 
was their daily entertain-
ment. 

The Chick's grand-
daughter, Jerrilea Ann Hub-
ble has been ill again, and 
Berna Lee spent five days at 
the Hubble home. 

She reports much worse 
icy conditions in Stephen-
ville than here. 

Evelyn and Joe Ward went 
shopping in Brownwood 
recently. Joe went to Cisco 
for an eye examination and 

FOUR "NAUTICAL NECESSIFIES," 
YOUR BEAUTY BONUS Will ANY 
$13.50 MERLE NORMAN PURCHASE. 

• 
Merle Norman's spring bonus gift "Nautical 	moisture balance of fragrance-free Eye Creme 
Necessities" includes lip and cheek colors, 	Complex. One per customer while supplies 
crisp and breezy clear. Plus the beautiful 	lost. Bring this ad to redeem your free gilt. 
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Rising Star Nursing Center 
Vieille !talon 	 Atilthr Director 

FEBRUARY 10 
Donett Nall 
Helen May 
La Verne Lee 

FEBRUARY 11 
Janna Jones 
Darin Leonard 
Roy Draper 

FEBRUARY 12 
Kelly Harris 

FEBRUARY 13 
Beverly Stuart 
Johnny Cook 
Theo Boyd 
Sharon Cannistraci 
Faye Medley 
Judy Hill 

FEBRUARY 14 
Bilie Jean Pell 
Steve Hollis 
Mrs. J.M. Alford 
Sherry Weaver 
Lee Weathersby 
Lydia Shults 
Donna Beth Rodgers 
Roland Earp 
Amy Turner 

FEBRUARY 15 
Mary Hord 
Jerry Knight 
Amber Clay 

FEBRUARY 16 
Sandra Ingram 

FEBRUARY 17 
Danny Cook 
Marilyn Isom 
Cherry Lee 
Torn Perkins 
Sarah Pittman 
Amy Davis 

FEBRUARY 18 
Lamar Gregg 

FEBRUARY 19 
Opal Whiteside 
Lee White 
Shanon Shore 
Ronald Majors 
Donald Majors 

FEBRUARY 20 
Victor Childers 
Mike Fisher 
Eddie Barker 
Ladell Hamer 
Harold Pierson 
Danell Jackson 
Judy B. Hill 

FEBRUARY 21 
Jennifer Linney 
Orietta Lester 
Ray Alexander 

FEBRUARY 22 
Curt Smith 
Bobby Nell Brown 

FEBRUARY 23 
Lue Watkins 
Jerilyn Winfrey 
Jeff Rust 

Sipe Springs 
Our community was sad-

dened by the death of Jim 
Whiteside of Cross Plains 
and a native of here. Ser-
vices were at Cross Plains 
and burial in Sipe Springs 
cemetery Saturday morn-
ing. We extend-  our sym-
pathy to his family and all 
relatives. 

Mrs. Doris Mitchell of New 
Castle has been visiting Mr. 
and Mrs. John McKeehan. 

Dale Cagels of Stag Creek 
spent Friday with the T.A. 
Weaver's. 

Visitors at the N.L. 
Leonard's were Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Stokes, Mr. and 
Mrs. Hardy New of 
Brownwood, Mr. and Mrs. 
Billie Stokes of Fort Stockton 
and Mrs. Tommy Guthery of 
Gorman. 

Monday: In-room exer-
cise, passed out mail and 
played bingo. Players were 
Martha Irby 4, Joe Fox 3, 
Vera Forbes 3, Elizabeth 
Robertson 3, Jennye Turner 
6, Pearl Petty 1, Vera Hill 5, 
Ethel Moore 1, Ronald Ma-
jors 1, and Buster Rixford 2. 
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01989 Eastland County News-
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466500) 

Second Class Postage paid at 
Rising Star, Texas, under Act of 
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every Thursday. Publishers, Mr. and 
Mrs. H.V. O'Brien. 
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Eastland County and 30 mi. radius 
of Rising Star, $9; other Texas coun-
ties $13; out of Texas, $19; No out of 
U.S. without APO. 

POSTMASTER: Send address 
changes to The Rising Star, Box 
127, Rising Star, TX 76471. 

rap seAnfirr witli ire' creath 
and talked about our new 
President. 

Wednesday: We decorated 
our wreaths for Valentines 
and played bingo. Players 
included Martha Irby 5, Jen-
nye Turner 2, Joe Fox 3, 
Vera Forbes 1, Vera Hill 1, 
Lela Clark 1, Pearl Petty 1, 
Ethel Moore 1, and Buster 
Rixford 2. 

Thursday: Passed out 
mail and did in-room ac-
tivities. 

Friday: We passed out 
mail and played bingo with 
players Martha Irby 5, Joe 
Fox 5, Vera Hill 9, Lela Clark 
2, Jennye Turner 3, Maggie 
Christian 3, and Buster Rix-
ford 2. 

Our thanks to the 
Methodist Church for Sun-
day services. 

Fullen Motor Co. BIG 
COUNTRY N 
CHEVROLET 
DEALERS 

The United Methodist 
Women met February 13 in 
the U.M.W. room. Mrs. Mag-
gie Smith gave the opening 
prayer. Winnie Armstrong 
presided. 

Final plans were made for 
a bridal shower for Melissa 
Hoggett February 18 in the 
Fellowship Hall from 2 to 4 
p.m. 

The 7th chapter of Luke 
was discussed and taking 
part were Deariso Duensing, 
Maggie Smith, Mamie 
Joyce, Maurine Wells, Dicie 
Adams, Inez Hutton and 
Winnie Armstrong. 

May Pearl Hull is still con-
valescing and is missed very 
much. Dismissal was a 
prayer in unison. 

Lakewood News THE rt.-7  WEST TEX 
r 

Valentine's Specials 
1988 

'49.1  Sprint 4-dr. Hatchback Sedan 

For as Effie as 

$ 8,289.°° 
includ ing rebate or 

4.9% 
interest 

or elibible 4.9% interest, includ ing rebate 

Spectrum 4-dr. Sedan 

For as little as 

$9,198°° 

For as little as 
$ 7 11 COO includ ing rebate or 

• v.,  41, 
4.9%  interest 

eligible 

LAKEWOOD BOARD: Congratulations to our new 
board members for the coming year. Pictured are, back 
row, L.E. Allen, past president; and Ray Parrish, new vice 
president; and, front, James Alexander; Jim McKay, 1989 
president; Volley Williams; Dcnnis Kelly; Frances Taylor, 
secretary; and Gary Westerman. 

We want to thank L.E. Allen for the wonderful job he 
has done and we look forward to a wonderful year with 
this group. 

Cavalier RS 4-dr. Sedan $2,500.00 
REWARD 

1988 
For as little as Nova 4-dr Notchback 

Sedan 

Any person with informa-
tion leading to the arrest and 
indictment of the person or 
persons responsible for the 
crime may call 643-4261 or 
643-3421. Information may be 
given anonymously and ar-
rangements will be made for 
the payment of the reward. 

Money may be mailed to 
First State Bank, Rising 
Star, 76471, to be deposited in 
the Witt Reward Fund. The 
attou:“. number is 72-360-6. 
No arrests have been made 
in the rape/murder case. 
Era Witt, 87, was found dead 
in her home on June 7. 

$ 9,535°° •  A  ow  . includ ing  rebate or 'la /0 interest eligible. 

TODAYS AMERICA Fullen Motor Co. 
305 East Main Eastland 629-2676 CHEVROLET 



• 1 RANGER AUCTION 
T QfTlie  LANTY RV() 

PAT MAYNARD REAL ESTATE 
WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS!! 

629-8568 MAYNARD BUILDING HWY. 80 EAST EASTLAND, TEXAS 
HOMES WITH ACREAGE 

Like New! Beautiful 3 BR, 2'/, Bath, Brick, Ap-
prox. 2,825 sq. ft., CH/CA, Custom Drapes & Blinds, 
Fireplace, Breezeway & Deck, Many Extras, includ-
ing 8.65 acres. $110,000. 

3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick, Approx. 2,200 sq. It, CH/ 
CA, Carpet, Drapes, Fireplace, Sep. I-iv/Dining, Big 
Kitchen, Nice Oak Trees, situated on abt 10 acres. 
$130,000. 

3 BR, 2'/2  Bath, Carpet, Builtins, Large Master 
BR & Living Area, Formal Dining, fenced & 
crossfenced, 9.3 Acres. $60,000. 

Two-Story, 5 BR, 2 Bath, White Frame, Covered 
Porch & Balcony, Huge Oak Trees, Situated on 
13V Scenic Acres, Fenced & Crossfenced. $110,000. 

3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick, CH/CA, Fireplace, Formal 
Dining Rm., Near Eastland & Lake Leon, plus 9.67 
Wooded Acres. $65,000. 

Unique Two-Story Cedar Home, Very Modern, 
CH/CA, Rock Fireplace, Super Sky-Lites, Large 
Master BR Suite w/Sitting Rm., Abt. 2,376 sq. ft., 9 
Wooded Acres, $85,000. 

Brick Two-Story, 3 BR, 2V2  Bath, Approx. 3,000 
sq. ft., Petrified Wood Fireplace, CH/CA, Good Stor-
age, Good Fences, On Approx. 10 Acres. $89,000. 

Extra Nice 3 BR, 2 Bath Doublewide across from 
Lakeside Golf Course, CH/CA, Fireplace, Builtins, 
Carpet, situated on Approx. I Acre, EASY TERMS! 
$29,000. 

5 BR, 2 Bath, Frame w/Siding, Approx. 2,200 sq. 
ft., CH/CA w/Heatpump, Situated on 5.5 Acres. 
$50,000. 

3 BR, 2 Bath, Two-Story, Carpet, Fireplace, 
Large Living Area, Great Location, Needs Some 
Work, 2 Acres. $3090. 

3 BR, 2 Bath, Doublewide, CH/CA, Builtins, 
Fireplace, near Eastland Lake & Lakeside Golf 
Course, On Approx. 1 Acre. $43,000. 

4 BR, Approx. 2,000 sq. ft., Spacious Kitchen, 2 
Tanks, Water Well, Plus smaller 3 BR House on 
Property, Approx. 22 Acres. $65,000. 

2V, Wooded Lots w/Moblle Home Hookup, 125' 
x 140', $8,000. 

Hillcrest Addition, Residential Lot in Choice 
Location, $10,000. 

Oak Hollow Addition, Just 4 Lots Left! $7,500 ea. 
8 Residential Lots, Buy One or All, Good Devel-

opment Area, $2,500 to $5,500. 
Wooded Lot Near Eastland Lake, Approx. 3/4 

Acre, $9,200. 
La Mancha Area, Lake Leon, Lots Priced from 

$2,500 to $12,000, some w/Staff Water Meter. 
Cute 2 BR Frame 2/Brick Trim, CH/CA, Carpet, 

Builtins, Custom Drapes, Ceiling Fans, $32,000. 
Lake Leon, New 3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick, Deeded Lot, 

Staff Water, Beautiful Redwood Deck overlooking 
lake, $85,000. 

Near Lake Leon Dam, 3 BR, 2 Bath Modular 
Home on 1.5 ac., CH/CA, Carpet, BLittIns, Fireplace, 
Two-Car Garage, Ship & Shed, $45,000. 

Lake Leon, 3 BR, IV, Bath, Brick, Deeded Lot, 
Staff Water, Boat Dock, Deep Water, Furniture 
Included, $45,000. 

Lake Leon, 3 BR, 1V4  Bath Mobile Home under 
Full Roof, 14' x 70', CH/CA, Builtins, Boat House & 
Dock, Deeded Lot, Staff Water, $35,000. 

HOMES AND LOTS: CISCO, 
RANGER, OLDEN, CARBON, 
GORMAN, MORTON VALLEY 

EASTLAND HOMES AND LOTS 

4 IIR,,3 .B4dt, MA-AU:try, Brick, Approx. 5,000 
sq. ft., Format 	& Dining, Den, Gnmerposn, 
Fabulous Kitchen, All the Amenities! $200,000. "11  

S BR, 31/2  Bath, Brick, Sep. Living Areas w/Huge 
Den, Fireplace, Double-Size Master BR Suite, Up-
stairs Studio, Solarium, Garage Apt, & More! 

$1WiCIBIXR, 2 Bath, Approx. 2,471 sq. ft., Situated in 
Exclusive Oak Hollow, 2 CH/CA Units, Fireplace, 
Builtins, Wet Bar, Garden Tub, Mission Brick, 

$99,500  3 BR, 13/, Bath, CH/CA, Ceiling Fans, Custom 
Drapes, Formal Dining, Spacious Kitchen, Large 
Master BR, B-B Court, Detached 3 Rm. Garage, 

$64)rrand New! 3 BR, 2 Bath, CH/CA, Plush Carpet, 
Builtins, Ceiling Fans, Corner Lot, Pretty S. Seaman 
St., $68,500. 

3 BR., 2 Bath, Brick, CH/CA, Custom Drapes, 
Ceiling Fans, Fireplace, Builtins, Covered Patio, 
Sprinkler System, Storage Shed, Privacy Fence, 
$72,500. 

3 BR, 11/2  Bath, Brick, CH/CA, Carpet, Builtins, 
Fireplace, Playroom, Storage Bldg, Corner Lot, 
PRICED TO SELL! $48,500. 

Extra Large 3 BR, 1'/, Bath Frame, CH/CA, 
Builtins (Including microwave & trash compactor), 
Carpet, Nice Kit. Cabinets, Massive Den w/Woo-
dburning Heater, $38,500. 

Nice & Affordable! 3 BR, P/, Bath, Frame w/ 
Siding, 5 Ceiling Fans, Refrig. Window Units, De-
tached Garage & Storage Rm., $24,500. 

3 BR, 2 Bath, Near Tennis Courts & Track Field, 
Woodburning Stove, Dishwasher, Extra Insulation, 
2 Storage Bidgs, Fenced Backyard, $28,000. 

3 BR, 11/2  Bath, Brick, CH/CA, Builtins, Covered 
Patio, Gas Grill, Electric Garage Door Opener, Part 
aPtly:5,5w. 

 Frame w/Brick Trim, Vaulted Ceiling In 
Fenced, $34,000. 

Living Rm., Carpet, Fenced Yard, Carport w/Stor-

ge
3 BR,  

4 BR Frame on 2 Lots, CH/CA, Cooktop & Oven, 
Garage, Storage Bldg., Covered Patio, Formal Din-
ing Rm., Carpet, Cyclone Fence, Large Shop Bldg., 

$37G51 Deal! Extra Nice Brick Duplex, Valley 
View Addition Near Schools, 2 BR, 2 Bath on each 
side, CH/CA, Builtins, Carpet, $55,000. 

Rock Two-Story, 4 BR, 2V1  Baths Downstairs & 
3 BR, 1 Bath Upstairs, Modern Kitchen, Formal 
Dining, Sep. Living Areas, Fireplace, 2-Car Garage, 
& More! $120,000. 

2 BR, Frame w/Slding, Carpet, Storm Windows, 
New Privacy Fence, Screened Porch, $29,500. 

Large 2 BR, I'/, Bath, Big Den, cH/CA, Carpet, 
Double Carport w/Rental Unit, Chainlink Fence, 
Lots of Trees, $24,000. 

2 BR, 1 Bath, Frame w/Slding, Gas Range & 
Oven, NiceTrees,Garage,Fenced Backyard,$17,000. 

Large 2 BR House to be Moved, $8,000. 
3 BR Frame w/Brick Trim, Beautiful Remodeled 

Kitchen, New Carpet, CH/CA, Dishwasher, Fenced 
Yard, Storage Shed, $33,500. 

3 BR, 2 Bath, CH/CA, Carpet, Storm Windows, 
Ceiling Fans, Fenced Yard, Large Shed, New Plumb-
ing & Wiring, $33,000. 

4 BR, 1'/. Bath, Approx. 1800 sq. ft., near major 
convenience store, $20,000. 

3 BR Brick Two-Story, Approx. 2,000 sq. ft., plus 
Garage Apt. as an extra bonus, $39,500. 

3 BR on 11/2  Lots, Detached Garage, Storm Cel-
lar, Pretty Trees, Close In, Owner Finance, $18,500. 

2 BR, Fireplace, Patio, Corner Lot, big Oak 
Trees, 4 Lots In All, $26,000. 

2 BR Frame, CH/CA, Carpet, $28,500. 
4 Residential Lots, 50' x 150' ea., Near Conven-

ience Store & Schools, All For $10,000! 
Valley View Addition Near Schools, 2 Nice Resi-

dential Lots, 90' x 150' for $6,500 and 112' x 150' 
Corner Lot for $8,500, or Buy Both for $14,500. 

Ranger, 3 BR, 2 Bath, Mobile Home to be moved, 
CH/CA, Bulitins, 14' x 76', $13,500. 

Ranger, Approx. 5 ac w/2 Mobile Home Hook-
ups and City Water, $4,000. 

Carbon, Like New 3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick, CH/CA, 
Carpet, Drapes, Builtins, Fireplace, Storage Bldg., 
Two-Car Garage, Corner Lot, Extra Nice! $52,500. 

Carbon, 3 Room House, Owner Finance, $2,500. 
Cisco, Close In, LargeTho-Story w/full Attic and 

Basement, Ideal Location for "Bed & Breakfast" or 
Comfortable Family Home! 

Olden, 3 TIR, l'/, Bath; Oily VlateriStorutt&ba-
10115 lOrPiCel la r, PCP aess A "pro x,2,96 m4.434500, 

Oldelc3ER, 2 Bath, Brick, 2 Living Areas, CH/ 
CA, Covered Patio, Carpet, Carport, City Water, 
Approx. 1 ac., $36,500. 

Olden, 3 BR, 1V1  Bath, Brick, New Carpet, CH/ 
CA, Ceiling Fans, Large Utility Rm., Covered Patio 
w/Gas Grill, 2 Water Wells, 18 Pecan Trees, 2.2 at., 
$65,000. 

Olden, 3 BR, IV, Bath, Brick, CH/CA, Fireplace, 
Builtins, Utility Rm., Covered Patio, Storage Shed, 
Chainlink Fence, Approx. 1 Ac, $69,000. 

LAND: FARMS, RANCHES, & 
SMALL ACREAGE 

741.6 ac., 4 tanks, water well, approx. 155 ac. in 
cultivation, good to fair fences, shed/barn, some min-
erals, $400 per ac. 

296 wooded acres, 3 tanks, Westbound water on 
frontage rd., some minerals, good to fair fences, Ideal 
Location between Eastland & Cisco, $400 per ac. 

2493 ac., 2 tanks, Sabana River, 140 ac. Cultiva-
tion & rest pasture, oak & pecan trees,'/, Minerals, 
$500 per ac. 

190 ac., mostly wooded, Some cultivation, good 
fences, 3 barns & corrals, 2,000 sq. R. Austin Stone 
Home, $215,000. 

166 at. near Eastland, good road frontage on 2 
sides, good fences, some cultivation, lots of trees, 
excellent hunting, corrals, $550 per ac. 

162 ac., 4 tanks, 100 ac. In cultivation, good 
fences, owner finance, $600 per ac, 

153 ac., 3 tanks stocked w/catfLsh & bass, fenced 
& crossfenced, small barn, 2 sheds, corral, some 
coastal, $550 per ac. 

146 ac. pasture land, oak trees, 1 lank, Hwy. 
frontage, fenced, some minerals, $550 per ac. 

75.5 ac, all wooded, good hunting, near Olden, 
$525 per ac. 

50.6 ac. near Eastland Lake, some coastal, good 
fences & set of pens, creek, pecan trees, 3 tanks, $840 
per ac. 

40 ac. wooded tract, owner finance, easy terms, 
can be divided, $36,000. 

26.15 at., Hwy. 80 between Eastland & Cisco, 
Westbound Water, I tank, mostly all coastal, $825 
per ac. 

20 at. near Lake Leon, 1 tank, mostly kline grass, 
owner finance, $27,000. 

14 at. coastal SE Eastland, county road frontage 
on 2 sides, ideal homesite, $12,500, Financing avail-
able. 

7.21 ac. near Olden & Eastland, 1 tanks, road 
frontage, $14,420. 

COMMERCIAL 

Eastland, frame church Bldg. w/Half-Bath, Cen-
tral Air, Ceiling Fans, Approx. 1,200 sq. ft., Storage 
Shed, $15,500. 

Cisco Motel w/Living Quarters & Two-Story 
Shop, Just $20,000! 

1,800 sq. ft. Business Building on Corner Lot, 
$48,000. 

50' x 100' metal building on 38.693 ac., 1.20 
Eastland, $214,000. 

Two Nice Brick Duplexes, Live in One Side & Let 
Other Side Pay the Payment! $36,000 & $55,000. 

50 ac. Prime Commercial Property In Eastland, 
Can be divided. 

31 ac. on 1-20 near Olden, water, sewer & electric-
ity, some RV Hookups. 

1-20 & Hwy. 6, Eastland, property on 3 different 
corners, be ready when new truck stop goes in on 4th 
corner! 

Fully Equipped Service Station on W. Main, 
Eastland, 2 Bays, Office, Shop Building, $60,000. 

1-20 Eastland, Approx. 5,000 sq. ft. metal build• 
ing on 2/3 ac., Priced To Sell! $76,000. 

Modern Office Building, 1-20 E., Eastland, 8 
Offices, Kitchen & Conference Room, 2 Rest Rooms, 
CH/CA, Carpet, 2,880 sq. ft., $75,000. 

Miracle Mile, 2.8758 ac., Perfect Location for 
Business or Office, Also has a house on It, $80,000. 

R.O. (BUCK) WHEAT 
BROKER 

KAY BAILEY 
ASSOCIATE 

6294.566 

WAYNE CHANDLER 	ROSEMARY FERGUSON 
ASSOCIATE 	 ASSOCIATE 

734-2762 	 453-2375 

DEBRA MAYNARD 
ASSOCIATE 

11411-2011 
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610 Conrad -Ifilitint  Xv-e-IVasetir 
442-1880 

Business & Home Phone 
CISCO HOMES 
Call Us! Homes under $10,000. Owner Fin. Possible. 
Assumable! Only $1,100 down, approx. $150 month. 
Come Look - Numerous 2 & 3 BR homes under $20,000. 
Attention Horseowners! 3 BR, 1 3/4 bath home on 4 lots, 

large barn, with stables. 
Large Older Home, 3 BR 13/4 bath, 2 living areas, formal 

DR, CH/CA, detached apt., 3 lots, owner fin. ay. 
Recently remodeled 2 BR home, large work shop, 4 lots, 

plus water well and many trees. 
New Carpet, freshly painted 3 BR home in nice area, 

some owner fin. available. 
Spoil yourself with this 3 BR, 2 bath home, Sep Den, patio, 

carport, many extras, including custom cabinets. 
Peaceful neighborhood! Lovely 3BR 1 3/4 bath home, 

CH/CA, 13 lots, water well, plus a 2BR home. 
Super Special, 3BR 1 3/4 bath, CH/CA, spacious DR/LR 

comb., Sep. Den, fireplace, large fenced yard, many trees. 
Extras Galore! Lovely 3BR home, CH/CA, fireplace, 

covered deck, carport, large storage bldg, beautiful yard. 
Country Club Rd. Rock Home on approx. 1 acre, 2BR, 

CH/CA, orchard, owner fin. available. 
Nice selection of 3 & 4BR brick homes with CH/CA, star-

ting at $27,000. Various sizes. Call for details. 
Two story Homes, several styles to choose from, just 

waiting for your finishing touch. 
RESIDENTIAL LOTS: Call for details. 
HUD REPOSSESSIONS— Call for information. 
LAKE CISCO AREA: Various priced and sized homes. 
FOR RENT: Large 9BR, 2 bath older brick home and a 
freshly painted 2BR home. Both are in Cisco. 

Needa
COMMERCIALplacetostart  Pa  RneuOyuEsinResns? 

  
ES 

b 	Try downtown 
Cisco. Only $14,000 for building with CH/CA, owner fin. ay. 

Doctor's Clinic or Large Office Building, like new, with 
CH/CA, large parking area. 

ACREAGE AND COUNTRY HOMES 
Approx. 40 acres, Westbound Water, 2 tanks, good bldg. 

site. 
South of Cisco, 98.63 acres, partly wooded, $21,500. 
Approx. 13 acres, sandj, loam, coastal, oak trees, $11,000. 
Spacious 3BR. 1 3/4  bath rock home, LR, den, office, 

large kitchen, sun room, on 4.07 acres. 
3BR brick home on 29.6 acres, mostly wooded, tank. 
Large 3 or 4BR. 21 2 bath brick home, CH/CA, fireplace, 

on approx. 160 acres, 3 water wells and 3 tanks. 

Ann Williams 	Cathy Wallen 
Broker 	 Associate 
442-1880 	cERR5104 	442-2120 
illsmwERS 

BIG COUNTRY R.E. 
DANA (BRK) 442-3958 

442.1693 

11011/4  W. 12th 

New 3 bd, fire pl, patios, hot tub, secluded, nice. 
4 bd Brk, Ig rms, cent H/A, carport, corner lot. 
100'X25' lot on Beech corner, make offer. 
2 Sto Victorian, iblk, total remod, best locale. 
80 ac, 2 homes, orchard, elec fences, equipment. 
3 bd remod, fire pl, carport, on 5th, Cisco. 
No down, you finish, owner parry, 3 bd brk 
72 ac, brk, fire pl, pool, office S. Cisco. 
HUD repos-Duplex- Commercial bldgs- Lots 
JEFFREY 643-3129 	PENNY 442-1707 

Moving to Eastland County? Or 
anywhere in U.S.A. Call Toll Fre 
1-800-525-8910 Ext. 4365 for 
information. (No Rentals Please)  

Barbara Love, Inc. 	Highway 80 Fast 
Broker 	 Eastland, Texas 76448 

629-1725 	629-8391 
EASTLAND 

LOTS AVAILABLE 75' x 150'. $750 down. OWner 
financing.E14 
PRICE REDU 	WNER SAYS SELL this 
5 yr. old mobile 	h many extras on a fenced 
lot.E17 
NEAT, FRAME 2 BR, 1 bath home with possibili-
ties. Fenced yard, large steel building. PRICE 
REDUCED!E2 
NEW DECOR in the process for this 3 BR, 2 bath 
home In Oak Hollow Add'n. Special financing.E4 
THIS 3 BR, I bath Frame needs some work & is 
PRICED TO SELL!E7 
SHIP SHAPE - Remodeled, 2BR, 1 bath, complete 
with mini blinds.E31 
YOUR DREAM HOME! 3Br,2,/1  bath in exclusive 
neighborhood. Study, entertainment centers and 
more add to the beauty of this 3 yr. old home.E35 
AFFORDABLE CRESTWOOD HOME • Spacious 
3BR, 2 bath, beautiful kitchen, sunken LR, sauna, 
much more. CALL TODAY!E36 
COUNTRY LIVING IN TOWN! Nearly new large 
custom home. Heat pump, rock fireplace, office. 
Beautiful oak covered Iot.E23 
STOP! Look at this budget S-T-R-E-T-C-H-E-R! 2 
BR in nice neighborhood. Under $15,000.00.E1 
GREAT PRICE & LOCATION for growing fam-
ily. Needs some work, 3 BR, 2 bath.E38 
WELL KEPT 3 BR, 2 bath home, large gameroom 
and storage. Beautiful yard, privacy fence.E3 
TREE COVERED lot & custom 3 BR, 1V, bath 
home. 3 car gar., sprinkler sys., sun room & More! E8 
BUDGET PRICrj jRg 2 B R,1 bath frome home, 
carport, Stg. Nic 	, pretty yard.E1O 
NEEDS SOME WORK! 2 BR, 1 bath frame with 
carport!F-21 
LIVABLE & LOVABLE, 3 BR, I bath brick. Some 
built-ins. Nicely landscaped. Priced under 
$40,000.00!E27 
STORAGE GALORE in this 3 BR, 2 bath home 
with sunken den. 4 car carport and workshop. 
NICE!E29 
VACANT LOT • COMMERCIAL AREA, near 
downtown. Fronts*: on N. Lamar, access from 
Patterson St. Owner will nnance.F.30 
ON A BUDGET? PRICE REDUCED on this af-
fordable 2 BR, 1 bath home - lg. living area, garJ 
carport.E25 
SHADED CORNER LOT - 2 BR, 1 bath frame. 
Central heat, metal stg. bldg.E6 
OWNER FINANCE • 3 BR, 2 bath, large home on 
corner lot. A bargain at $19,500.00.E12 
SHORT OF CASH? flexible financing available 
on remodeled 3 BR, 2 bath frame home, central H/ 
A.E24 

split 10 ac & house. Some cult., peanut quota & 
more. NW of Desdemona.HA 11 
198 ACRES with early 1900's home • joins Eastland 
City Limits. EXCELLENT TO SUBDIVIDE! Hwy. 
frontage, rustic trees.HA8 
FIXER UPPER! 2 BR, 1 bath on 1.5 AC, mil. Nice 
setting. Large trees.HA16 
32 ACRES m/1 with 3 BR home, access to Lake 
Lean. Staff Watt+ & welk:atock tank, barn, shed. 
producing gas well, ',Li-royalty. HA I7 
"NEARLY NEW" 3 BR, 13/, bath brick on 4 acres 
surrounded by oak trees. A nice place!HA19 
CUSTOM 3 BR, 3V2  bath with beautiful lake view. 
Satellite dish, split bedrooms, Jacuzzi. MANY 
EXTRAS!HA4 
PRICE LOWERED on 3 BR, 2'/, bath brick on 5 
acres near Lone Cedar Country Club.HA7 
COUNTRY RETREAT! 5 Acres with lovely, large 
3 BR, 2'/2  bath brick home,,„2 living areas, 2 fire-
places, many amenities.HA3 
CISCO-2 BR on IV, Acres, City sewer and water 
makes for country living in the City!HA4 
112.1645 ACREliiistvnh 3 BR home. Cult., sandy 
soil, highwa 	age. REASONABLY 
PRICED!HAIO 
NEAR LONE CEDAR COUNTRY CLUB Beauti-
ful Brick house alas. Spacious 3 BR & den or 
4 BR, 21/1  bath, many extras!HA7 
40 ACRES WITH 2 BR HOUSE-needs some re-
pairs. Land is cleared, sandy soil, some coastal, 
some minerals. Stock tank, city water well. EX-
CELLENT LOCATION!HA 21 
OAK TREES SURROUND 6'/, yr. old 2 BR, 1 bath 
on 7.9 Acres. $10,000 down & Owner Finance!HA5 
ROCK HOME & 10.8 ACRES-Convenient to 
Eastland, Cisco, Bredtenridge. 3 BR, 2 bath. Well, 
barn, tank. OWNER F1NANCE!HA22 
OLDEN-"ROOM TO SPARE"-extra large home 
& 10 ac, 3 garages & more!HA20 

ACREAGE 

omit 

LAKE LEON-EXCELLENT RECREATIONAL 
OR BUILDING SITE! Approx. 4 acres with high-
way frontage and lake frontage. Trees!A1 
SO. OF CISCO, 158 AC, peanut cultivation, pas-
ture & wooded with deer. Highway frontage.A3 
OWNER SAYS SELL-239 Acres, some coastal, 
brush, pasture, 3 tanks. Turkey, Deer & 
MineralsA17 
80 ACRES W. tat cult., pasture, bottom 
land A10 
RANGER, 92.675 ACRES-Scattered trees, some 
coastal & minerals. 3 Stock tanks, water well & 
septic system. Good building site!A5 
8.9 ACRES, CARBON-excellent location, on pave-
ment. City water, some treesA6 
LAKE LEON-20 ACRES ma, stock tank, barn, 
fenced. Adjacent deeded waterfront lotA8 
CARBON, 125 AC, m/l-2 small tanks, fenced & 
crossfenced. Some Improved grasses. Highway 
frontage. Good building site!All 
N. OF EASTLAND-393.48 ac. Various native 
grasses, oak & mesquite trees. 3 tanks. Deer, turkey 
and quail.A4 
2 ACRES-MORTON VALLEY excellent building 
site. Water meter available. Highway frontageA9 
EDGE OF EASTLAND, 3/4  acres homesite • oak 
trees, dty utilities availableA2 
51922 AC. LAKESIDE COUNTRY CLUB. Nice 
building site. Owner Flnance!Al2 

LAKE LEON-New 3 BR, 2 bath, brick home on 
deeded waterfront lot, under construction. BUY 
NOW and choose carpet.013 
LAKE LEON-Beautiful waterfront lot with large 2 
BR towne,fireplace, central H/A, Staff water. VERY 
N -106 
R 	' UER-3 BR, 2 bath Brick on nice lot. F/P, Cen. 
H P., Kit. built-ins.05 
C. sit BON cozy 3 BR, 2 bath on nice 1°1022 
CISCO, Beautiful remodeled home on corner lot. 
Privacy fence, above ground swimming pool. Near 
school. A steal at $39,000.00!01 
RANGER-COUNTRY ATMOSPHERE& 3 BR, 
1V, bath brit* on nice Lot!O4 

CORIAIRRCULL 

NOUSE WITH ACREAGE 

SPACIOUS 2 BR, 2 bath home on 1.4 AC, mut 
Central H/A, F/P and more!HA14 
PRICE REDUCED-4 BR brick on 225 AC or will 

BARBARA BOSTICK BARBARA LOVE 
442-3822 	 647-1397 

LOOK! EXCELLENT COMMERCIAL PROP-
ERTY! 125 ft. frontage on access road at 1-20 exit 
with 2500 sq. ft. metal building. Inventory 
optional.C1 
153' OF 1-20 ACCESS FRONTAGE, near Eastland 
with 2.5 ac. & office. Excellent set up for oilfield 
business.C3 
EXCELLENT L 	N, excellent automotive 
type building & =Great opportunity!C4 
LAKE LEON AREA-Store w/3 BR, 1 bath home. 2 
underground fuel tanks. Hookups for 4 mobile 
homes & 7 campers. PRICED RIGHT!C5 
4 APARTMENTS In need of a helping hand. 
PRICED CHEAP!C6 

CINDYE FOSTER 	SHELLY RICHEY 
629-8227 	 629-3614 

oak & 
Gourdeir 

REAL ESTATE 

sh wmanship technique will 
be provided. sAmerican Heart 

Assoc lotion 
WERE FIGHtinG 10? 
CUP to E 

steer sold for $50,000. 
The calf tipped the scales 

at 1,250 pounds for the Sur-
day show and will be sold 

Friday. 
Gina Stroud of Eastland 

won resent champion An-
gus. 

+ 4-H NEWS 
By Crystal Wilbanks, County Agent 

April Moylan Wins First Major 

Show Grand Championship 

The Next Best Thing - 

...to a clear conscience and a good night's sleep is the feeling of security 
in owning your own home with a clear title. Peculiar to the real estate field, 
values are based on land and the improvements thereon, if any. But values on 
these are based on the title. The title then comes the most important item to 
be considered when purchase of real property is contemplated. So be careful 
to buy good title based on an abstract of title or a policy of title insurance. 

Eastland County 
Abstract Company, Inc. 

Eastland, Texas 
	

817-6291077 
CERRS104 

shooting sports with our 4-H 
members. Two adults within 
the county have volunteered 
to help develop a 4-H Shoot-
ing Sports Club. 

Stay tuned for further de-
tails. 

Announcing the 1989 4-H 
Shooting Sports Instructor/ 
Coach Spring Workshop... 
This workshop is designed 
for adults and senior 4-H 
members willing to coach or 
manage a shooting sports 
program within the county. 
Workshop sessions will in-
clude: Basic Shotgun, Ad-
vanced Shotgun (skeet or 
clay), Smallbore Rifle, Arch-
ery, Basic Pistol, Muzzleload-
ing Rifle, Smallbore Silhou-
ette and Personal Protection 
Course. NRA Instructor Cer-
tification will also be offered. 

This workshop is sched-
Wed for March 3-5. 1989. a( 
the Texas 4-H Center near  
Brownwood, It will begin  
with registration Friday eve-
ning, with sessions on Satur-
day and Sunday. 

Regi stration. forms may be 
picked LID at the county Ex-
tension office and are DUE 
BEFORE MARCH 1 1989  

There is a lot of interest in 

breed championships and 
reserve honors. The San 
Antonio show was his first 
major show entry, though. 

Chris Scaggs, the show's 
judge from Kansas State 
University, liked his thick-
ness and correctness, Moylan 
said. Several hundred steers 
were exhibited during the two 
days of judging. 

The calf was bred and raised 
by the family, Jim Moylan 
said. 

As always, when a youth 
wins a major steer show, 
speculation about what to do 
with the prize money begins. 

"It'llgo in my college fund 
- whatever I get," she said. 
Last year's grand champion 

April Moylan of Eastland 
exhibited a Chianina steer 
named Max at the San Anto-
nio Livestock Exposition 
Sunday and ended up win-
ning her first major show 
grand championship. 

Moylan, a 15-year-old 
sophomore at Eastland High 
School and an Eastland 
County 4-H member, is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Moylan. 

"I was just really excited," 
Moylan said Monday morn-
ing. "I thought he was good, 
but, well..." 

The calf has been shown 
about 25 times throughout the 
summer. winning several 

Don't forget the 4-H 
Showmanship and Grooming 
Clinic Contest scheduled for 
Saturday, Feb. 25, at the 
Eastland County livestock 
showgrounds. Sessions and 
time frame are as follows: 

Dairy goats: 9-10 a.m. 
Rabbits: 10-11 a.m. 
Lambs: 11- 12 Noon. 
Cattle: 12-1 p.m. 
Swine: 1-2 p.m. 
Horses: 2-3 p.m. 
A114-H members with live-

stock projects arc encouraged 
to attend. Trophies will be 
given to Champion Showman 
in each division. 

instructions on how to pre-
paic your animal for show 
and one-on-one work with 

we 
couldn't 
wait for 
Spring! 

The Eastland County 4-H 
Youth Leadership Task Force 
will give $50 to the county 4-
H Club that has the most 
participation at the County 4-
H RoundUp. County 
RoundUp is scheduled for 
Saturday, April 1, 1989. 
RoundUp activities will in-
clude contests in Method 
Demonstration, Illustrated 
Talk, Share-the-Fun and 
Judging Team Events. 

acirst place winners in each 
division will advance to Dis-
trict 8 4-H RoundUp sched-
uled for Saturday, April 15, at 
Tarleton State University in 
Stephenville. 

Method Demonstrations 
and Illustrated Talks may be 
presented on a variety of 
topics including animal sci-
ence, nutrition, clothing, 
health horse, wildlife, and 
many others. All 4-H mem-
bers arc encouraged to pres-
ent a demonstration or talk. 
For more in formation, ',lease  
attend the Method Demon-
stration Training scheduled  
for this Saturday. Feb. 18, 
from 10:30 a.m, to 12 Noon  
at the TU Electric Redd v  
Room in Eastland. 

lbs., .95-1.03; 300-400 lbs., 
.90-.95; 400-500 lbs 85-.90; 
500-600 lbs., .80-.84; 600-700 
lbs., .75-.80. 
COWS & CALVES: Good 
600-750; Plain 475-700. 

Stockers 500-690. 
BULLS: Bologna 58-64; 
Stockers 70-77; Utility 

50-58. 
STOCKER 	STEER 
CALVES: Choice 200-300 
lbs., 1.05-1.40; 00-400 lbs., 
.95-1.05; 400-500 lbs., .90-.95; 
500-600 lbs., .86-.89; 600-700 
lbs., .80-.86. 
STOCKER HEIFER 
CALVES: Choice 200-300 

NEW SPRING FASHIONS 

Olo 
OFF 

Eastland Telegram - 
Ranger Times - Cisco 
Press And Rising Star 

Thursday, 
February 16, 1989 

SELECTED 

Blouses, 
Fashion Pants, 
Fashion Skirts 

The Market at Ranger 
Auction was steady to 
strong on Stocker Calves & 
Feeder Yarlings, Packer 
Cows selling higher & Spr-
inger Cows selling strong, 
on a run of 250 head of cat-
tle at its sale Thursday, ac-
cording to Jim Carruth, 
reporter .  
COWS: Choice 45-50: Good 
4 7-5 5; Canners 3 5-4 5; 

We carry Junior. Misses and Women's size Fashions 
-Our Personal Service Makes The Difference 

MODE O'DAY 
101 Lain WAS 14 

• 



ACTION REALTY 
WE NEED LISTINGS!!! 

Equal Housing Opportunity 

915-643-6516 
Rising Star 

REDUCED, REDUCED 28R, 18, 
dining room, fenced garden, 2 
story. All on corner lot. CALL. 
NEW ON MARKET, 3 BR, 18, 
on highway 183, dining - liv-
ing room combo, garden area, 
rock. All this is priced to sell. 
STAY WARM in this 2BR, 211, 
carpeted, fireplace, lots 
more. Large lot with mature 

• pecan trees. Call Stella. 
BE THE BOSS! Working Grocery 
store, on highway. Call Stella 
today! 
WHAT MORE COULD YOU 
NEED?? 3 BR, 2B, lots of 
closets, well-kept, carpeted-, 
laundry room.. Call today.. 
DON'T PASS BY! 3BR, 28, din-
ing room, carpet, water well, 
storage buildings. 
LOOK, LOOK, LOOK! 2BR, 113, 
ceiling fans. Lots more. Call 
Stella. 
BY THE PARK!! 2BR, 18, 
metal roof, has major ap-
pliances. Out of town owner 
needs to sell. Call Stella. 
NEED ROOM TO EXPAND? 
2BR, 1 B, dining room, 
acreage. Call Stella. 
LAKE BROWNWOOD! 2 lots at 
Shamrock Shores. Priced to 
sell. 
CLOSE TO SCHOOL 2811, 1B, 
large rooms, fenced back yard 
on paved street. Priced to 
sell. 

James Smith broker 646.0297 

IN RISING STAR 
STELLA WARE 	643-3591 

limemesmal 
HOUSE FOR SALE: Remodeled 
with wood stove. 3 droom. 
Call 915-643-2537. 1 3-12 

SELLING YOUR HOME OR BUY-
ING? Call Stella Ware, 
643-3591, your local real 
estate agent for Action Real-
ty, Brownwood, James Smith, 
broker. 	 26-52 

FOR RENT 

MOBILE HOMES: Bank 
foreclosures. Easy terms, all 
sizes. 	Call 	Kay. 
817-643-5107. Art's Mobile 
Homes. 	 7-9 

REPO 1985 FLEETWOOD 3 BR, 
w/air, wood siding. Only 
$149 per month. Call Art's 
Homes. 915-643-3608. Hwy. 
377 E. Brownwood, TX 	6.7 

NEW OAK CREEK doublewide, 
3 BR, 2 bath. Special show 
home. ONLY $259 per month. 
Call 	Art's 	Homes 
915-643-3608. Hwy 377 E. 
Brownwood. 	 98.16 

Public Housing Authority 
has apartments for rent 
for senior citizens. Equal 
housing opportunity. 
817.643-3812 	or 
643-6791, RISING STAR 

MOBILES For  
Sale 

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS 
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENT 
LILLISTON-ILMC 

PLANTERS-DISKS-- DRILLS 
ROLLING CULTIVATORS-CHISELS 

SELL OR TRADE 

CLARA TRACTOR* surety  INC. 
Alb 	DeLIDON 

i915) 351-3111 COMANCHE 
frttere your business La appreciated. 

WE WOULD APPRECIATE YOUR 
JOHN DEERE. LILLISTON & 

ILMC PARTS BUSINESS.  

LOWEST PRICES IN AREA ON 
ADAMS PLOW SHARES AND BAL- 

DAN DISK BLADES, IN STOCK 
SIZES TO FIT MOST BRANDS 

CLARK TRACTOR * SUPPLY INC. 

COMANCHE OM 3343022 
DtLEON (0171103.2001 

FOR SALE 

FOR SALE; Clean sofa 
loveseat, beige tweed 
$150.00; 	Frigidaire 
refrigerator 17 cu. ft. Good 
condition, almond $175.00; 
Custom Craft fiberglass 
camper $350.00. Call Frank 
643-2271, 643-3189 	6.7 

GOLF CART BATTERIES 
$75.00 for 6 

You Put In 
$90.00 Installed 

Tires, New, $24.50 
915-893-2662 

FOR SALE Golf carts & golf 
cart trailers. To see, come to 
3rd house on 1-20 west of 
Union Hill Rd. between Baird & 
Clyde, or call 915.893-2662 

b52 

PARAKEETS for sole. Call 
817-643-2441. 	 7 

COWDOGS OUT of registered 
stock, half blue healer half 
calahoula, 	$ 2 0 . 
915-854.1321, or after 5 
854-1108 	 b7 

FOR SALE Excellent quality 
coastal sprigs, 893-2167 or 
893-6913 	 10 

SERVICES 

CARPET CLEANING Commer- 
cial/ Residential. 	Free 
estimates. Scotchguarding 
available. We move all regular 
furniture. Carpet sold, 
repaired, installed. New or us-
ed. No mileage charge within 
40 miles of Cross Plains. Dub 
Meador (817) 725-7720. 

Bring your TV, radio, 
stereo, small appliances 
to DAD'S DOO-DADS & 
REPAIR SHOP at 300 S. 
Graves, off W.Hy. 36, 
Rising Star. New & used 
merchandise. Shop work 

-only. 217 643-5909 

RADIATOR REPAIR 
at 

Butler Motor Co. 
Gerald & Ricky Bailey 

BUDDY COOK 
Residential, Commercial 
Refrigeration & Plumbing 

817.643-7312 
Rising Star 

FAST DEPENDABLE 
Film Developing 

PALACE DRUG STORE 
643-3231 	Rising Star 

WILLIE VANDIVERE 
TRUCXING 

Dirt, Caliche Hauling 
Build Lease Roads, 

Driveways, etc. 
9 -5 Call 643-2023 

After 5 Call 643-6451 

OLIVER WEST, PUMP 
SALES & SERVICE 

817.643-4683 

Rising Star, Texas 

Complete systems sold & 

serviced 

21/2  miles south of town 

Hale Trailer Dealer 
2 Horse Trailers 

Gooseneck Horse & Stock 
Trailers, Covered & Open 

Bumper Pull Stock Trailers, 
Covered & Open Top 
Barker's Garage 

817-259-2252 May, Texas 

conoco Mobil Oil Products 
Texaco Oil Products Pennzoil Golden West 	 Gulf/Chevron 

Farm Fuel Delivered 

CROSS PLAINS PETROLEUM 
(E.S.E. Inc.) 

P.O. Box 219, 6th at Ave. F 
David and Lenell Sliger 	Cross Plains 
Managers 	 (817)725-6582 

Home Phone 643-5742 

CAREY'S AUTOMOTIVE 
(then Mon.- Fri. 7:30 

Sat. 	8 a.m.- 

James Carey, 
Hwy. 36 East 
Shop Phone 643-7009 

, 
Gasoline & Diesel 

a.m. - 6 p.m. 
12 noon 

Mechanic 
Rising Star 

, 	Rs52 
. 	...... 

REBUILD 
ENGINES 

OWNER 

JAKE LANDESS 

,_ 

Aluminum 
AUTO 

Welding 
TRANSMISSION 

JAKE'S SHOP 
GENERAL MECHANICAL 

& WELDING FABRICATION 

Body Work a 	Painting 

404 N MAIN 
817-643-3031 	RISING STAR, TX 

rs52 

Open 

Hwy. 

Jackie 

183 

Main 
Auto 
Monday 

Palm  

Street 

8 - 5 P.M. 

- Mechanic 

• 
Star, Texas 

Repair 

643-1701 

- Friday 

ore 

Rising 

Susan J. Schaefer 
Certified Public Accountant 

9th & Main 	P.O. Box 501 
Cross Plains, Tx. 76443 

Office: 	Home: 
817-725-6747 817-442-3784 

NEW STORE 

TYRE TEAM, 
INC. 

JOE KENNEDY-Manager  

Buy 3 Kelly Tires And Get 
The 4th Tire FREE! 

5()/0 
'All Car & Truck Tires Thru 15" 

Plus Our Service Department Offers 
Front End Alignment, Brake Jobs & Tune-Ups 

American Made & Foreign Cars 
Along With Total Tire Service 

Dan Hudson-Mechanic on duty 
with 24 years experience. 

i hursday, February 16, 1989 
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LEGAL NOTICE 
REAL ESTATE 

OF AMERICA

0  
TODAY'S 
CHEVY TRUCK 

Short Wheelbase 

Extended Cab 

Pickups 

( Simular To Picture ) 

WANTED 

if you are carrying a note on 
property and NEED CASH for 
it, call 915-337-4872. 	4-7 

WELDING - Will do ANY TYPE 
of welding. Corrnls, steel 

*buildings, ect. Also dozer 
work. Call 643-3275 	1-12 

HELP WANTED 

NEEDED: LVNs, 6.2 & 2.10 
shifts. Salary negotiable. Con-
tact Russell Gray at Rising 
Star Nursing Center. 
643-2691. 	 49-2 

OPPORTUNITIES 

OPEN YOUR OWN beautiful 
discount apparel store. 
Jean/sportswear, large lady, 
infant-preteen, maternity. 
Over 400 nationally known 
brands. Fixtures, inventory, 
training, etc. $13,900.00-
$22,900.00. Mademoiselle 
Fashions 501-849-2134 	7 

Sealed bids will be accepted on _-
a poly 200 gallon tank by the 
Rising Star Rural Fire Depart-
ment. The tank may be seen 
during regular business hours 
at Murphree Oil Company, 
310 W. Mills Street in Rising 
Star. Bids must be received by 
February 25, 1989. Please 
mail bids to Rising Star Rural 
Fire Deportment, tio Barbara 
Murphree, 	Secretary- 
Treasurer, Route 1, Box 153, 
Rising Star, Texas 76471. 
(Please write BID on 
envelope.) Bids will be opened 
on March 2, 1989, at the 
regular meeting of the Board 
of Directors. The Board of 
Directors of the Rising Star 
Rural Fire Department reserve 
the right to reject any or all 
bids. 	 7-8 

Fullen Motor Co. 

31 00  partially timbered, good deer, 
turkey, sandy loam soil, good 
fences, $400 per acres. 
1400 ACRES, 2 sets of im-
provements, $ acre lake, 11/2  
mi. of Sabanno creek, good 
deer & turkey, $500 per acre. 
238 ACRES, Sipe bprings. 
Pavement, 2 tanks, good deer 
& turkey area, only $350 at., 
20 percent down. 
320 ACRES, most all Kline 
grass, excellent fences, 1 mi. 
of creek, big tank, 2 mi. road 
frontage. $500 ac. 
$600 ac. 15 percent down. 
80 ACRES near Carbon, about 
20 cultivated. 1 well, tank, 
big oak trees & road on 3 
sides. $575 cc. 
145 ACRES SW of Rising Star. 
Steel corral, excellent fences, 
75 Coastal & Ermelo, fine hun-
ting, 1/2  off pavement, low 
taxes. $550 ac. 1/4  down. 
161 ACRES Lots bottom land, 
pecans, 60 tillable, well fenc-
ed, 1/2  mile Sabanno, good 
deer hunting, lots big oak, 
pecans. $550 ac. Agent own-
ed. 
58 ACRES, Several big trees, 2 
tanks, some coastal, most 
new fences, lots road front. 
5550 cc. E-ZZ terms. 

Listings appreciated. 
34 Yrs. in Business 

COGBURN REALTY 
893-6666 	893-5898 
893-2642 	DE LEON 

305 East Main Eastland 629-2676 

ANNOUNCEMENT 

12-WEEK FICTION SEMINAR 
taught by Linda Carol George, 
to begin in March. Call NOW. 
817-643-3011 	o r 

817-643-2061. 	 7 

NOW OPEN IN CROSS PLAINS 
"Ellen's Closet" consignment 
store (next door to barber 
shop). Now taking con-
signments on men's, women's 
and children's clothing, toys, 
games, baby furniture. 
Garments must be cleaned, 
mended, on hangers and ready 
to wear. Watch for Grand 
Opening. (817) 725-6322. 

3-7 

LIVESTOCK 

ANGUS BULLS for sale, James 
Ratliff bus. 817 647-1260, 
res. 647-1667, Ranger, TX 

r14 

ANGUS BULLS for sale, 817 
647-1155 or 647-1182 r104 

SERVICES 

OPEN ADMISSION 
POLICY 

It is the policy of Rising 
Star Nursing Center to admit 
and to treat all patients 
without regard to race, col-
or, national origin, age, sex, 
religion, occupation or han-
dicap. The same re-
quirements for admission 
are applied to all. Patients 
are assigned within the 
home without regard to race, 
color, national origin, age, 
sex, religion, occupation, 
handicap or disability to in-
clude blindness or deafness. 
There is not distinction in 
eligibility for, or in the man-
ner of providing, any patient 
service provided by the nurs-
ing home or by others in or 
outside of the home. All 
facilities of the nursing home 
are available without 
distinction to all patients and 
visitors regardless of race, 
color, national origin, age, 
sex, religion, occupation or 
handicap. All persons and 
organizations having occa-
sion either to refer patients 
for admission or to recom-
mend Rising Star Nursing 
Center are advised to do so 
without regard to the pa-
tients race, color, national 
origin, age, sex, religion, oc-
cupation_ or .13auslicap. or 
disability 	include-041.  
ness and deafness. Patients 
needing post hospital follow-
up care and rehabilitative 
care will be admitted to this 
facility provided their needs 
can be met either directly or 
in cooperation with com-
munity resources with which 
facility is affiliated, or has 
contracts. Patients suffering 
severe psychiatric pro-
blems, alcoholism, drug ad-
diction, tuberculosis or other 

JIM RATLIFF 
WELDING 
Oilfield and Form 

817-643-6464 
Rising Star

N 

communicable 	disease 	or 
those requiring skilled nurs-
ing care are not admitted 
unless approved by the pa-
tient care committee or the 
Texas 	Department 	of 
Health. Every patient will 
have to have a designated at- 

D & R UPHOLSTERY 

643-3942 	Rising Star 
For 	your 	upholstery 
needs. 
Country, Continental & 
Saloon style curtains. 

Debbie Jones, owner 

tending physician upon ad-
mission with a choice of an 
alternate. The policy of Ris-
ing Star Nursing Center wil 
be to make the entry process 
informative and pleasant for 
residents and families and to 
minimize 	their 	fears 	and 
anxiety. 

— BROWNWOOD 

(eashr.nt fireed.) 

MUFFLER 
SHOP= 

1  

.d.i, 	//6..i ,,A,..A., A.,, tyr6,.9-  • 
(915)646-0716 

---- 	

200 N. Main 	 Owner 
via 	 Brownwood, Tx 76801 	James P. Smith 

ii. 

FOR 

Rt. 1. Box 
May TX 
817-259-3204 

WELLS 
76857 

RADIO 

82A 

DISCOUNT 

"FAST 

1-800-535-7562 

EQUIPPED 
FRIENDLY 

"._..1 
I 0 

FOR CASH 

TRUCKS 

PROPANE 

SERVICE" 

Hwy 377E 
Comanche. 

915-356-2516 

Box 425 
TX 76442 

.... 

trirn 

PS 

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE CO.'S 
PERSONALIZED SERVICE 

Dee Wilson, Agent 
l a,* 	 COS foCKAUINSUIAWI•• 

HOME 

Rising Star Office 
M-W-F 9:00-12:00 

RE TIREMENT PLANS 
LIFE • LIABILITY 
AUTO 	HEALTH 

OWNERS BOA15 

Ph. 

EASTLAND. 

Now 

Office 

Home 

643-1210 
PO BOX 470 

TEXAS 

81 7/629 1 
817/442-3601 

Open 

76448 

704 



RED RIND LONGHORN 
CHEDDAR CHEESE 
ARMOUR 
CHICKEN NUGGETS 

MARKET 
SAUSAGE 

MADE
... 	 .4 1.69 

„..,„.69c 
GOOCH 
BOLOGNA 	 ,_,.$1.19 

TOILET 
TISSUE 
NORTHERN 4 ROLL 

99 NORTHER 

C 

STUFFING 
MIX 

STOVE TOP MICROWAVE 
ASSORTED FLAVORS 99c 

SLICED PICNIC 

HAMS 
LB. 

89c • 

(WASH. X-FANCY RED DELICIOUS 59  
AA 

APPLES 	LB. 

WASH. X-FANCY GOLDEN DELICIOUS 59  
c) APPLES LB. 

ORANGES SUNKIST CALIF. NAVEL 	1B49c KIWI FRUIT .,,.„,A 	31$1 TURNIPS RUTABAGA 	 3 LOS.  FOR $ 1 
D'ANJOU PEARS L.69c YELLOW ONIONS ...Si POTATOES.... LA9c 

CAKE MIX 
DUNCAN HINES 

18 OZ. 

COFFEE 
FOLGERS 

13 OZ. CAN 

$ 7 99 

MACARONI 
& CHEESE 

KRAFT, 8.7 OZ. 

2/$1 
TETLEY 	1DINA 

TEA BAGS.. 4a8ar,s 	1.49 
UTOPIA  
DRINKING WATER  
RALSTON MORNIG • FUNNIES CEREAL ,.

N
. 	2 99 

JERKY 	
,  

0
-,-  
	L  I Y  

1 
TREATS ,. 

 

Sq1,7 

69c 
$1.99 

5 QT. BUCKET 

GANDY'S 
ICE 	k 499  
CREAM 1r 

.  

BRAWNY 1 
 

TOWELS 
ROLL 

69c,  

NESTLE 
QUICK 

32 OZ_ 

99 

SANTITAS 
BUY 1 
GET 1 
FREE 

1 
HAMBURGER 
DILL SLICES 

BEST MAIO, 32 OZ. 

$ 1 69  
COCA-COLA 

------- 	12 OZ. CANS 
6 PACK 

SLICED BEEF 

LIVER 
LB. 

59c 
It.) Am MR. TURKEY 

GROUND TURKEY 

,20,pkG$1.99 	
MR. TURKEY 
DINNER FRANKS 

▪ - 

KELLOGG'S 	KELLOGG'S' 	KELLOGG'S' 	KELLOGG'S" 
CORN FLAKES 	ROOT LOOPS' 	MUESUX' AA. 	MUES.1...1 

*159 '8 .248 21, $29 9 9,5, '29914,1.‘ 

PARKAY 
QUARTERS 
NABISCO 
NEWTONS 

• EVAPORATEDN7 DRYPERS 
DIAPERS 	@nation 	MILK 

CARNATION 13 OZ 
Ike 

$ 8 9 9   °44- 2/$1 
1 

CHOCOLATE 
CORDIAL CHERRIES 

HERSHEY'S. 8 OZ. BOX 

CHOCOLATE 
TURLES 

DE MET 'S, 6 OZ BOX 

	1 

DISHWASHING 

LIQUID 
SUNLIGHT, 12 OZ. 

CORN 

ige11411 
ps 

la;`a 



SAVINGS 

en 	THROUGHOUT THE STORE: 
r, 	LOOK FOR SPECIAL SAVINGS TAGS 

SPRING • 
JEWELRY 	• COSMETICS 

• GIFTS 
• NAME BRANDS • ART 
• NOVELTIES 	*STAPLES 

• GLASSWARE 
• FIRST-AID 

AO An Up-To-Date Pharmacy 
You Can Depend On! With Free 
Delivery! 

Cards Accepted: 
Medicare 	ACS 
Mini-Med 	BlueCross 

& Others 
Don Stoner Pharmacy 629-2681 

CENTRAL 
DRUG 

103 W. Main St. 
NORTH SIDE OF SQUARE 

EASTLAND 

Alcohol 
16 oz. 
494' 

Spectro-Vite 
Vitamins 

130's 
$399 

Compare 
to Centrum 

Oil 
Paintings 

with 
Wood Frames 

$4000  

ter-ie.  ;74 
Crest 

Toothpaste 
4.6 oz. 
$119  

Acutrim 
20's 
$339 

Drixoral Plus 
12's 
$200 

B-D 
Micro Fine IV 

Syringe 3/10 CC, 
1CC or 1/2 CC 100's 

#8430, 8410, 8465, 
8413 8412 
$1588 

Gillette 
Foamy 
11 oz. 
$159 

SPECIAL 

Downtown Behind 
The Beautiful Trees 
On The North,  Side 

Of The Square 
Worth Looking For! 

Ne. ONCLitvER 
P0191 letERICIA 

ivn name 

Depend 
$559 

The Cisco Songwriters had 
many plans to discuss at 
their delayed February 
meeting. Among them: a 
tour of a professional recor-
ding studio. 

The next club date, the 
evening of March 2nd, has 
been set aside for a trip to 
Longhorn Recording Studio 
in Clyde. That facility has 
state-of-the-art, twenty-four 
track recording. This will af-
ford members a first hand 
look at an important seg-
ment of the music industry. 

In Thursday's program, 
Ruth York of Cisco concen-
trated on building and main-
taining momentum as a 
songwriter. "We want you to 
keep writing," she said. "So 

circles. Members finished 
their first, second, or third 
renderings only to change 
places and try a fresh sub-
ject. The meeting reluctant-
ly broke up about 9 p.m. 

The Myrtle Wilks Art Club 
will next meet March 11th. 
Those interested may con-
tact an officer at 442-3962 or 
442-3530. 

SCHOOL 
ft 	KIDS 

ARE 
EVERY- 
WHERE 

SO DRIVE 
WITH 
CARE! ,,,z24,144  
School , back 

in session, 

so watch for 
children and  

be extra rare- St., kik.' 
rut driving- especially 
during the time before 
and after daises. 

Prater Equipment Co. 
Heavy Equipment Contractors 
Roads 	 Brush Work 
Utilities Dams Developments 

Free Estimates 
817-842-5878 	817-842-5244 
No Job Too Small or Too Large 

5.104 

We Will Meet Or Beat Any Competitive Prices. 

Call Us Now For Fill Up Prices. 
Discounts For Cash Delivery. 

L\ 	U 	Chaney Gas Co. 

	 4-4 	 

0113- Wyriiisigas 

708 W. Main, Eastland 
(Across From H 8 R Lumber) 

629-1751 After Hours 	 5.104 

Gayle - 629-2128 Charles - 629-8614 When the time comes... 
LET US LOVE & CARE FOR 

Your Loved Ones. 
Providing T.L.C. in I.C.F. 
EASTLAND MANOR NURSING CENTER 
1405 W. Commerce Si, Eastland 817-629-2686 

Peggy Pryor, Administrator 
Call soon for complete details 

and information CER RS B10+ 

Dick Mania, Y.P. 

SUMMER\ 
DISCOUNT 

$3995  DBL. 
KIDS FREE 
12 8 UNDER 

Hyvy 80 W. 	629.3519 	EastIond 

Red's Steakhouse  iN  
& Club  

Friday & Saturday 
Feb. 17 & 18 

"Mixed Company" 

Next door In The Steakhouse... 

Thursday - Sirloin For 2 $995  

NEW - Catfish! 
Open Mon. - Fri. 4 - 12 p.m. 	Sat. - 4. 1 

Now Open Wed. 	Closed Sun. 

BEATY/ TALLEY 
TRAVEL 

A Full Service Agency 

r With Our New Automated 
Reservation, We Can Now 

Issue BOARDING PASSES! \, 	 ./ 
Maynard Bldg. 	Suite 1A 
Eastland 	817-629-8504 

5-104 

BEM INTERIORS 
1706 W. Commei ce (Hwy. 80 W.) 

Eastland (817)629-1319 c71104  

Draperies  

Custom Made 
In Our Shop  

The Most Trusted 
Name In Window 

Covering  

Decorator Accessories 

Gift Boutique 

Cisco Songwriters Plan 

Field Trip For March 2 
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----------- VIP Wit SFr OM CO 7,C Cr 11.1. inlis Mr lt• TY AN t. as 

INSEISMIIIIIO trir•sr NN,I• lskIsse ••••11-/ -:' Orris t• i's 
' • 	

A, .'./, •Th -:.....C.••1:11/11 
. ' . 

PS 

MP 

g1.1.: 4. -I 	 Briefs MS 0 •• . News % 
I= u.. 	 . 	'sk 

1111111•A s . 	 • • 	 . 
MINS or- • : 	 ' 1.  '' ; '.....41= 

111111111• h1,1- • ss. '.' • : ls :f V ••;• . .1‘.7...1' X I.' 11.. ers Ps A • sail s es -•••• 021•L•• •• .....• . 44444 II II la MI 
IIIIM MIIII MO OS or. IAIrAti-  un Par PIA lid GAS Obi a cm a a 	um me am es as au --w  

I= MI MN = MIll M MO INIS MP IS I= M =la el• OM MN Mil Mk MI ••I OM MD NMI INN = 

be the speaker. She is with the 
Southern Baptist Convention 
as coordinator for alternatives 
in abortion. The public is 
invited to the East Cisco 
meeting, and there will be no 
admission fee. For those inter-
ested there will be a dinner 
served at 6:30 p.m. before the 
meeting. 

Myrtle Wilks Art 

Club Studies 

will consider an approval of a 
Resolution that will require 
the demolition and removal 
of certain dangerous struc-
tures and public nuisances. 
Council members will also 

be presented a proposed en-
gineering study of William-
son Dam at Lake Cisco. This 
study was done by Jacob and 
Martin Inc. The study was 
recommended by the Texas 
Water Commission. 

Sunday evenings." 
Members contributed Li\ 

entertainment. David Price 
of Carbon played and sang a 
gently flowing religious 
number written last year. 
Kevin Reed of Cisco sang 
"She's Everything to Me," a 
spirited tribute to his wife 
Deborah. • Lack of time 
precluded other presenta-
tions. 

Cindi Barr of Eastland, 
performer, entertainer, and 
Cisco Elementary music 
teacher, announced that she 
has accepted a position with 
an opry house in Bransom, 
Mis:muri. She will work full 
time in this emerging enter-
tainment center. Members 
voiced congratulations 
tempered with a sense of 
loss, since Cindi has been in-
strumental in many club ac-
tivities. 

Other items of business in-
cluded organizational details 
and discussion of a spring 
showcase for members' 
works. 

The March meeting and 
trip are little more than days 
away. Anyone seeking more 
information may call 
442-3530 for details. 

school, and he and his par-
ents, Dr. and Mrs. Cleatus 
Rattan, indicated they were 
very happy about the football 
scholarship. 	E.H.S. 
Headcoach Ron Sanderson 
said he was also happy for his 
star student to get his first 
choice to a college. 

In an effort to raise money 
for the purchase of 4-H and 
FFA animals at the Eastland 
County Livestock Show this 
spring, the Eastland Ag 
Boosters are selling advance 
tickets for a Bar B Q to be 
held on Saturday, March 18. 
Tickets are $100, which will 
admit two people. A door 
prize of a 1989 pickup of the 
owner's choice will,  be given 
during the Bar B Q. Several 
dealers are participating, in 
order to offer a nice vehicle 
for the winner to choose from. 
Tickets to the event may be 
obtained from any member 

of the Ag Boosters. 

never let an idea get away —
whether it's for a song, a 
phrase, a title, or a melody. 
Jot it down or record it im-
mediately." 

Ideas are everywhere, she 
added. In books. On radio. 
TV. Billboards, signs. Pro-
verbs, sayings, idioms, slang 
expressions. 

"Listen to people. Almost 
every conversation contains 
the germ of a song. Reach in-
to your own emotions, the ex-
periences of you, your fami-
ly and your friends." 

She concluded, "Go 
through your notes 
periodically. And write. 
Reward yourself, trick 
yourself, force yourself if 
you have to — but keep 
writing that next song." 

Ruth also noted that area 
radio stations air programs 
useful to songwriters. "For 
example, KVMX of Eastland 
carries six and KEAS, also 
of Eastland, has two. KEAN 
of Abilene broadcasts three, 
notably "Nashville Live" on 

Still Lifes 
A spotlighted table with 

not one but four still lifes 
greeted members of the 
Myrtle Wilks Art Club Satur-
day evening, February 11. 

"Remember the framing 
technique we discussed last 
meeting?" Myrtle Wilks ask-
ed the group. "Keeping that 
in mind, choose the display 
you like best. Then find the 
most interesting angle." 

A brief organizational 
scramble ensued, then 
silence as heads bent over 
blank paper. 

"And block in your shapes 
with light strokes," Myrtle 
reminded, "so you can 
change them if you need to." 

The circle of artists work-
ed on, glancing up frequent-
ly. Figures began to 
emerge: the lines of a 
famous race horse, a bird in 
flight, a kitten—all from 
statuettes; a translucent bot-
tle, pine cone, Indian corn. 

Myrtle praised and en-
couraged and coached. One 
four-year-old got specialized 
instruction in squares and 

TheCisco Baptist Associa-
tion will have their monthly 
rally at the East Cisco Baptist 
Church on Monday, Feb. 20 
at 7:15 a.m. The theme will 
be "Sanctity of Life," and 
there will be a film on the 
subject of abortion. Sylvia 
Soother, from the Home 
Mission Board in Atlanta will 

"How To Live With Dia-
betes," and "Nutrition For The 
Heart" are topics to be dis-
cussed at a Nutrition Seminar 
to be held at the Community 
Room of the Cisco First Na-
tional Bank at 6 p.m. on Fri-
day, Feb. 17. Dr. Jim Calvert, 

a registered nutritionist, will 
be sharing information of vital 
importance about the heart 
and circulatory system. He 
will tell how proper nutrition 
has helped him live with dia-
betes successfully. All inter-
ested persons are invited to 
the Seminar, and there will be 
no charge. 

EASTLAND 
County Judge Scott Bailey 

has proclaimed Feb. 13-18 as 
"Farm Bureau Membership 
Week" in Eastland County. 
This week is part of a state-
wide observance during 
which county Farm Bureaus 
will make a special effort to 
enroll new members, says Leo 
Williams of Ranger, Presi-
dent of the Eastland County 
Farm Bureau. John Kidd of 
Eastland is chairman of the 
membership committee. 
Other committee members 
arc Mac McWhorter of 
Eastland and Donnie Gray of 
De sdeni ona. The Texas Farrn 
Bureau is the largest such 
organization in the nation, 
with more than 325,000 
member families. There are 
216 organized county Farm 
Bureaus in the state, includ-

ing the Eastland County or-
--ganizatiorrt-John Kidd says 

the local County Farm Bu-
reau has 1,810 members and 
is seeding to exceed that fig-
ure in 1989. 

RANGER 
Nominations arc being 

taken for a number of awards 
to be presented at the Annual 
Chamber of Commerce Ban-
quet. The Banquet will beheld 
in March, with time and date 
to be announced. The Awards 
will include a Golden Deeds 
Award, with recognition for 
outstanding service to the 
Ranger Community, past or 
present. Also will be the 
Outstanding Agricultural 
Family Achievement award, 
which will note achievements 
in agricultural endeavors. The 
Educator of the Year will 
receive an award, recogniz-
ing outstanding service and 
dedication to educational 
ondcavors. There will also be 
awards to outstanding stu-
dents at Ranger High School. 
Nominations for these awards 
may be made in writing to the 
Chamberiof Commerce, Box 
57, Ranger, or by calling 
Shawn Wells at 647-5141 or 
Bob Galloway at 647-3091. 

Items on the agenda for the 
City Commissioners meeting 
Monday included the ap-
proval of the purchase of a 
1980 ton truck for the Water 
Dept., the possible purchase 
of a Police Auto, and discus-
sion of Bio-Med Disposal. 
Bob Cox would explain the 
Texas First plan by South-
western Bell, and there would 
also be an Executive Session 
for the possible hiring of fire-
men. 

The Retail Trades Commit-
tee of the Eastland Chamber 

of Commerce is conducting a 
survey to determine the opin-
ion of consumers on what they 
would like to see in the town. 
There are questions such as: 
"Would you shop more at 
home if businesses had dif-
ferent hours?" and otherques-
lions related to out-of-town 
shopping and in-town needs. 
The object is to let the busi-

nesses know how they can 
better serve the public. This 
survey was published in the 
Feb. 12 issue of the Eastland 
Telegram, and is to be re-
turned to the Retail Trades 
Committee by March 1. 

CISCO 
A Public Hearing will be 

held at 6 p.m. Tuesday, Feb. 
14 in the City Council Cham-
bers during the regular meet-
ing of the Council. Members 

All 4-H Club Managers are 
asked. to attend a training on 
Saturday, Feb. 18 from 9-
10:30 a.m. in the TU Electric 
Reddy Room in Eastland. The 
training will be on annual 4- 

• H Club Program Planning and 
other important items. Fol-
lowing the Training, there will 
be a 4-H Method Demonstra-
tion Workshop. This will 
conclude at 12 noon. 

Texas Christian University 
has signed E.H.S. star foot-
ball player Raiford Rattan to 
a scholarship at the Univer-

sity. TCU was reported to be 
Raiford's first choice as a 

The AAUW meet Thurs-

day, Feb, 16 at 7:30 p.m. in 
the home of Maria Da Rocha. 
Doris Piwonka will be co-
hostess. Connie Davis will 
give a program on Girl Scout 
activities. All members arc 
urged to attend. 

HOUSTON'S 
FABULOUS 

RISING STAR 
The Rising Star Annual 

Livestock Show and Fairwill 

be Saturday, Fcb. 1 F begin-
ning at 11 a.m. The food 
auction will begin at 1 p.m., 
followed by the pig show at 2 
p.m. and the lamb show at 
2:30. There will be numerous 
arts and crafts on display 
during the Fair, and the pub-
lic is invited to take part in 
these activities. There will be 
departments for Art, Photog-
raphy, Needlework, Crafts 
and Clothing, as well as the 
home-baked food. There will 
be a champion and reserve 
champion for each Depart-
ment, and high-point plaques 
for each class. 

?Platt 
MOTOR INN 

6700 SOUTH MAIN 

. ASTECWORLD/QkTERWORLD TICKETS 
AVAILABLE AT FRONT DESK 
. EXCELLANT BUFFET AT REASONABLE 
PRICES 
. BEAUTIFUL POOL AND GARDEN 
AREA 
• CABANA ROOMS AND SUITES 
. FREE PARKING 
- RISING TIDES CLUB 
. MAJOR CREDIT CARES ACCEPTED Wayne's 

Hobby Shop 
Radio Control 
Planes, Cars, 

Boats 
Hand Gliders 

979 E. Main 	Eastland 

629-2435 

713.522-2811 

HOUSTON, TEXAS 
Across From Texas Medical Center 

5 Minutes to Astrodome, Astroworld and Watenvorld 
Rice Stadium — Zoo — Golf Course Fat Stock Show—The Summit 
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WAL-MART LIVE PLANT GUARANTEE 
All live plants purchased at Wal-Mart are fully 
guaranteed. Simply return any dead plants with 
register receipt, and Wal-Mart will replace it or if 
not in stock, we will cheerfully refund your 
money. 

PLUS THESE GREAT VALUES 
EVERYDAY LOW PRICE . 

Qni®n Sets•••••••......•••••••••
.48 ••••• OOOOOOO 

Dormant Rose Bush••.•••••••••••••••••••••••••.297 
PottingSo ,10Ib.s• ••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••.964 

Peat Moss, 2 cu. ft. ....................••.••••.4.97 
Purpose Mix , 50 dry cits• ••••••••••••••••.4.96 

Flower Rock Granuies,1 cu. #1 .
..............3.27  

Marble Chips, 50Ibs• ••••....••••••••••••••••••.3.27 
River Pebbles, 50 lbs• •••..••••••••••••••••••••.3.27 

Spyfertikeri064.431,...,,,,,„„..........n.8.76  

Murray® Deluxe Push Mower 
22 Inch cutting width with easy height 
adjusters. 3.5 H.P. Briggs and Stratton 
engine. Fully baffled for smooth grass 
flow. 8 Inch radial tires. No. 9-22251X92. 
EVERYDAY 

EVERYDAY 	
Reg. 5.97 

EVERYDAY 
Your 
Choice 

Your 
Choice 

— — Long Handle Garden Tools 	Ortho Insect Sprays 

Choose from round point shovel, 	One pint. Malathion 50 
garden hoe or bow rake. Nos. AR248, Plus Insect Spray or 
YG61/4  ,2000P. 	 Diazinon Insect Spray. 

16.44 Reg. 
18.96 

Poly Tank Sprayer 
Two gallon. See through tank.  
Brass wand. No. 1992. 

3.97 Each 
Fled Clay Pot 
12 Inch diameter. Azalea 
three quarter pot. 

MADE IN THE 

	  IJSATalra 

MURRAY 

Weed-X Landscaping Barrier 
3 x 50 Foot roll. Porous landscaping barrier with a 5 year guarantee against weed 
penetration. The choice of landscaping professionals. No. WX-500. 

Reg. 74.94 

' '" 

Weed Eater® 
Gas String Trimmer 
15 Inch cutting path. 22cc 
engine with anti-vibe handle 
and Tap-N-Go line advance. 
No. GTI-15. 

Tire-Cord Reinforced Hose 
1/2  Inch x 50 feet, All brass couplings. 
Flexible, burst-resistant under pressure. 
No. L01250. 

Reg. 27.96 

SAVE $5.00 
True Temper®  Wheelbarrow 
4 Cubic foot capacity. Heavy 
duty steel tray with rolled edges 
and pneumatic tire. No. 5W-1. 

Industrial Lawn Edging 
4 3/9  Inches x 20 feet. 
Polyethylene. No. IND20. 

EVERYDAY 

497 422 Square inch cooking area. 30,000 BTU dual burner. Has two red-
wood side tables, space saver warming rack with basket and 
temperature indicator. No. 3649- 

Wed.-Sun. Feb. 15-Feb.19 	Hwy. 80 E. 
9-111VIon.lat. 12:30-5:30Sun. 	Eastland 

WAL-MART'S ADVERTISED MERCHANDISE POLICY—It is our intention to have every advertised 
item in stock. However, if due to any unforeseen reason, an advertised item is not available for purchase, 
Wal-Mart will issue a Rain Check on request, for the merchandise to be purchased at the sale pnce 
whenever available, or will sell you a similar item at a comparable reduction in price We reserve the 
right to limit quantities. Limitations void in New Mexico. 



A $70 
HEARING AID THAT 
DOESN'T HELP IS 

NO DEAL 
Sure. You may be able to find a very inexpensive hearing aid. But ask 
yourself if it helps you hear better than ever Chances are likely that al that 
price, it can't meet all your needs. 
Miracle-Ear may cost a bit more, but we believe that better hearing Is worth 
it. Arid when you buy a Miracle-Ear you get more than a hearing aid. 

You get SATISFACTION Including: 
✓ Custom fit, custom engineering 
r 2-year warranty 
r Professional service 
r Free hearing evaluations 
r Hearing aid service and repair 
r 450 convenient locations nationwide to serve you 
The authentic Miracle-Ear • is found exclusively al Miracle-Ear Centers. 
accept no substitutes. 

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 17, 9-12 AM 

, Miracle-Ear Center 
PALACE DRUG 

101 N. Mail, Rising Star Call Collect 915-643-6130 

Corsica LT 4-dr. Sedan 

Beretta GT 2-dr. Coupe 

ic's 
Int

a
roducin av

o 
Corsica & 

Beretta, the Best Sell-
ing Car Line in 
America! Wait Til 
You See What 
They're Going For At 
Your Local Chev-
rolet Dealer! Get 
$400 Cash Back & No 
Payments Til May!  

Billy Wayne and Kelly 
Owen are pleased to an-
nounce their exchange of 
wedding vows on January 8. 
The wedding, held at 7 p.m., 
was at the home of L.T. and 
Josie Owen, parents of the 
groom. 

The former Kelly Morris 

A wedding shower will 
honor Billy and Kelly Owen 
who married January 8. The 
shower will be Sunday, 
February 26, from 2 to 4 p.m. 
at the home of L.T. and Josie 
Owen. 

Melissa Hoggett, bride-
elect of Richard Collins, will 
be-honored with a wedding 
shower from 2-4 p.m. Satur-
day, February 18, at the 
fellowship hall of First 
United Methodist Church. 

Gift selections have been 
made at Higginbotham's and 
Palace Drug Store. 

The hostesses, members of 
United Methodist Women, 

4-H News 
' All 4-H Club Managers 

are asked to attend a training 
scheduled for Saturday, 
February 18th, from 9:00 -
10:30 a.m. in the TU Elec-
tric Reddy Room in 
Eastland. Managers will be 

training on annual 4-H club 
program planning and other 

important items. 

Classified Ads in 
The 

Rising Star 
GET RESULTS 

( 
attended school at Joshua. 
She is the daughter of Lee 
Metcalf of Grandview and 
Gene Morris of Lancaster. 
Kelly is employed at Movies 
& More in Rising Star. 

Billy is a 1981 graduate of 
Rising Star High School and 
is an oil field worker. 

Gift selections have been 
made at Higginbotham's, 
Palace Drug Store and Hub-
bard's Gift & Gallery. 

The hostesses invite 
friends and relatives to at-
tend. 

invite all friends and 
relatives to attend. 

Susan Freeman, a senior 
at May High School, has 
been chosen by the Cisco 
Wrangler Belles of Cisco Jr. 
College to accompany them 
to Washington, D.C. in May. 
The May Drill Team placed 
second in competition at the 
college. Jennifer Gregory, 
also of May, is Susan's alter-
nate. 

Susan is the daughter of 
John and Grace Freeman of 
May. Susan will perform 
with the Belles at the Apple 
Blossom Festival in 
Virginia. 	While 	in 
Washington, she will tour the 
White House, Smithstonian 
Institute and numerous 
historical sites with the 
Belles. 

Susan is seeking sponsor:: 
to help defray the expenses 
of her trip which she must 
pay in advance. Among her 
sponsors are the following 
businesses and individuals: 
Green's Photo and Video and 
Mrs. Dalton Moss, both of 
Brownwood; Jenkins In-
surance Agency, Fredda 
Criswell, D & T Building 
Supplies and Family Food 
Store, all of Rising Star; and 
Wells' Fuel Stop, Barkers' 
Garage, Chism's Service 
Station, Nelson's Peanut 
Dryer, Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Hardy and Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Sparkman, all of 
May. 

Susan and her family are 
very appreciative of the help 
she is being given for what 
she anticipates to be an ex-
citing trip. 

If you would like to help 
Susan, please contact her at 

• 
817-259-3921 or Kt. 1 lziox 144, 
May, TX 76857. 

30 
COLOR 

PHOTOS 

1-10x13 
(Wall Photol 

1- 8x10 
2- 5x7 
2- 3x5 

16-King Size 
Wallets 

8-Regular 
Size Wallets 

$1 099 
99t Deposit 

1.0" Due At 
Pick up 

Plus Tax 
WE USE 00000 PAPER 

lailiMittr 

HAVE YOUR EASTER 

PICTURES TAKEN NOW 
AT 

Higginbotham 
Bros. & Co. 
208 N. Main 

NO 
01.4,7 
ON 

101
,Nic  

o1[(0 

i

1 

Thur., 
I 	

Feb. 23 
8:30-5:00 

GPOUP CNAPSE 	
S 	Inc 

COLON 	f  

PHOTOS 	'' 

Wedding Shower Will 
Honor The Billy Owens 

Bridal Shower Will 
Honor Melissa Hoggett 

Susan Freeman Invited to D.C. 
Trip With CJC Belles 

Morris-Owen Say Vows 

ELECTRIC BEACH 
TANNING SALON 

Reopening Soon! 
For More Information 

Call 643-7304 or Come By 
417 W. Pioneer. 

BIG 
COUNTRY 
CHEVROLET 
DEALERS 

THE .4••••''''' OF WEST TEX 

FULLEN 
Motor Co. 

305 East Main 
Eastland 629-2676 

Thursday, February 16, 1989 

..........****.** 

* Support 
We Make Deliveries  ******************* 

At Home * Your Town - Shop 
We Gladly Accept Food Stam s 

Washington Extra Fancy 
Red cc Golden Dekious 

	

Apples 	4. ./.  , 	, 

	

5t. 	4, 	'' 

Sunkist Carrfornia 

Navel 
Oranges 

49t. 
", r,  

_ 
,447111 '';' 

Cardorria 

Wiwi Ftvit 

3/9.00 
Yellow 	_ 
Onions 	, 	, -H- , 

5111S/$1 •00 

Monterey 
Fresh White 	, 	A 

Mushrooms e 
8 oz. 	/ 	— 	, 

. 0 
1/2  PRICE 	

t; 
WI 

75' 

Smoked 8 Fut/ Cooked 

Picnic 

69 t. 
Sliced 794/lb. 

 
Pilgrim's 

Grade"A" 

Whole 
Fryers 

59b. 

Pride large Pork 

Spare Ribs 

79t. 

Price Saver 

Sausage 
Reg. or Hot, 1 E. 

794  
3 lbs. $ 2.37 

Coffee 

Non 
Creamer 

16 

$1.9929' 

-Dairy 
-Mate 

oz. 

Kal-Kan 

Can Cat Food 
Asst., 6 oz. cans 

Shurfine 

Pinto 
16. pkg. 

1/2  PRICE 

Beans 

Potted 
Vienna 

lathy 

51/2  

2/1.00 

s 

Sausage 
oz. 

Meat or Tuna 
Chithen 

Oil or Water, 

of the Sea 

6.5 oz. 

69' 

Toilet 

1/2  

Angel 

4 roll 

PRICE 

Soft 

pkg. 
Tissue 

Paper 
Asst. Jumbo 

Spillmate 

794  

Towels 
Roll 

O.B. 

Spaghetti, 

1/2  

Pasta 
Elbo Macaroni 

Brand 

PRICE 
7 oz. 

or 
Cherry 

Comstock 

21oz. 

994  

Pie Filling 

Betty Crocker 

Cake 

1/2  

10.25-10.75 

PRICE 

Mix 
Microwave 

oz. 

Duncan 

Cake 
Asst., 

, 	'/2 PRICE 

Hines 

Mix 
18 oz. 

Can Dog 
Asst., cans 

 

Kal 

2/884  

Kan 

14 oz. 

Food 

Shutfme 

Tea 
24 

$1.09 

Family Size 

Bags 
ct. 

Libby's 

'/2 

16 oz. 

PRICE 

Pumpkin 
BBQ 

11/2  

Shurfine 

18 oz. 

PRICE 

Sauce 

, 
Tortilla 

14 

Santitas 

1.29 

Chips 
oz. 

Margarine 
1 lb. 

1/2  

Po-rkay 

quarters 

PRICE 

Quarters 
Morton 

Frozen 
Asst., 

994  

Dinners 
8.5 oz. 

Pet Ritz 

Pie 

$1 

Deep 

Shells 
12 oz. 

29 

Dish Coke 
All Flavors, 

9.79 

& 7-Up 
6 pack cans 

Ranch Style 
Beats 

15 oz 

404 

FAMILY FOOD STORE 
North Main St. 	Affiliated Food Store 

	
Rising Star 

NEW STORE unuRc 
	Phone 	643-2221 

Monday-Sunday 	 Prices Effective: 

8:00 a.m.-6:00 p.m. 	 Wed., Feb. 15-Sat., Feb. 18 
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