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G0LDST0N COMMUNITY GOES 
OVER IN BIG BOND RALLY

In what is said to be one of the 
largest get togehters in many 
years, the people of the Goldston 
community got together last Fri­
day night and really had a bond 
rally that produced the results.

The Goldston community bond 
committee was headed by Cleo 
Woods and he went to work and 
really got the stuff together for 
the auction sale, and had a show 
out there that none of the partici­
pants will ever forget.

The bond sales totaled over 
$7,000 for the night and over $100 
was raised for the school fund.

Some items of the sale included 
hats donated by local merchants, 
and brought from $500 to $1,000. 
Leondis Yankee, a sailor who is 
home and from that community, 
put his little hat up for sale. It 
brought $1,000 the first time sold 
and was returned and sold again 
for $100.

The school house was packed 
and jammed and Cleo Woods add 
ed that he would like to thank 
each and everyone for their co­
operation in the rally in helping to 
put the drive over in his district

LELIA LAKE AND WINDY 
VALLEY TO HOLD RALLY 
FRIDAY, FEB. 11

Quinn Aten and Dr. H. R. Beck, 
captains of the Lelia Lake and 
Windy Valley school districts, an­
nounced this week their plans for 
a Bond rally and box supper to be 
held in a joint gathering at the 
Lelia Lake High School building 
on the night of Friday, Feb. 11th, 
beginning at 8 p. m. The program 
will consist of auctioning off the 
boxes prepared by the ladies of 
these communities for bonds. A 
band concert by the Clarendon 
Band, a short talk by R. E. Dren- 
nan and a short program by the 
Lelia Lake school students.

It was announced also that if 
there was too many boxes than 
could be sold for bonds, that they 
would be auctioned off to cash 
buyers and aid the USO quota for 
that district. Everyone is invited 
to plan to attend. *

Pruning Fruit 
Trees Correctly

Charles Reed, Donley County 
Agent, recommends the following 
suggestions:

Trees well cared for grow good 
fru it And, according to J. F. Ros- 
borough, horticulturist for the 
A&M College Extension Service, 
pruning of young trees has much 
to do with their successful growth 
and development.

M. W. Mosley was in town Tues­
day attending to some unfinished 
business, getting ready to move to 
a warmer climate soon. .

fr— — —

RATIONING 
AT A GLANCE

By PEPPY BLOCKER

1 w
ed from a selection of three to 
five branches. A space of at least 
six inches should be left between 
a chosen framework branch and 
the one above it. Otherwise 
crotches .will form which may 
cause limbs to break in later 
years. Second and third-year trees 
are pruned by taking off some end 
growth and thinning some of the 
inside shoots which are closing in 
the top of the tree. At the same 
time all water sprouts on the 
trunk and framework branches 
should be removed.

In most cases the method of 
prunihg varies with the species. 
Peach fcnd plum trees are pruned 
in about the same manner—name­
ly, removing about one-fourth of 
the cun-ent season’s growth. Ap­
ple* and pears require little prun­
ing beyftnd thinning the branches 
on young trees which tend to be­
come crossed up. This will mini­
mize damage from breaking in 
after years.

Facing a large peach tree with 
pruning shears and saw, Ros- 
borough says to do this: Begin the 
job from the inside of the tree. 
Do not remove the lateral, or side, 
branches which form the second­
ary growth. That would tend to 
make the fruit develop only on 
the ends of branches. Standing 
close to the tree, remove all 
sprouts except a few scattered 
ones which should be cut about 
half in two. These will send out 
side branches and provide some 
summer shade for the upper sur­
face of branches. After going over 
the inside of the tree, walk to the 
outside and with hand shears re­
move about one third of the cur­
rent season's long, excess growth. 
This may be done on plum as well 
as bearing peach trees.

The job done, the first step to­
ward having a better fruit crop in 
1944 has been taken. But gather 
up and bum the small branches 
sheared off. Left on the ground 
they make a good harbor for bor­
ers which would infest the trees 
later.

‘Seed Loans’ Now 
Available

Emergency Crop Loans, known 
generally as "the seed loans,” are 
now available to farmers for the 
production of vitplly important 
food crops and normal crops for 
1944, according to announcement 
of W. E. Farwell, Manager of the 
Dallas Emergency Crop Loan Of­
fice of the Farm Credit Admin U-

Applications for the loans in this 
county are being taken at the 
Donley County AAA Office in 
Clarendon, each Wednesday after­
noon by Field Supervisor, W. E. 
Anderson.

Funds obtained under these 
loans may be used to cover the 
general expense of crop produc­
tion including the cost of prepar­
ing the land, purchase of seed, 
feed, fuel oil, fertilizer and sup­
plies. A first mortgage on the 
crops to be financed is the secur­
ity required.

These loans have been made in 
this county for a number of years 
and have proven of great benefit 
to farmers of limited collateral 
whose cash requirements are 
small. The maximum loan to an 
individual is $400.00. Applicants 
who can secure loans from banks 
or other sources are not eligible 
for “the seed loans.”

As in the past, borrowers will be 
required to plant a large garden 
for home use and a balanced crop 
program will be encouraged.

After publication last month of 
suggested ceiling prices on liquor, 
the New Orleans District OPA of­
fice received two “orders” from 
newspaper readers who asked the 
office to send them certain quant­
ities of whiskey “as per your ad­
vertisement of OPA prices.”

• • •
Irene Cooper, Price Clerk of the 

Labette County War Pirce and 
Rationing Board of Parsons, Kan­
sas. sends in the following ditty- 
with apologies to that currently 
popular gal. the*“Pistol Packing 
Mama”i
Listen to the story of 
The housewives of the nation— 
They’re the gals who raise the 

howls
And help hold down inflation.
Hold them prices down, Babe!
Hold them prices down—
Stay right in there. Mama,
Hold them prices down.
Don’t go shopping at a store 
Where prices send you reeling, 
Patronize the honest guys 
Who don’t exceed the ceiling.
Hold them prices down, Babe! 
Hold them prices down—
Stay right in there. Mama—
Hold them prices down!

* • •
A woman recently visited the 

office of Luther Atkins, OPA Rent 
Control Manager for the Okla­
homa City District, and declared:

"You’ve just got to raise the 
rent on my property. I’m a poor 
widow and my only means of ex­
istence comes from the little I re­
ceive tram mg scent property 
---- And then, to •, there's the ex­
pense of my poor sick husband 
who is in the hospital."

Atkins, tactful and courteous, 
leaned back but failed in an effort 
to stifle a chuckle.

“And I’ll have you know some­
thing else, young man,” the visitor 
retorted. “This is no laughing 
matter.”

“Lady,” Atkins replies, apolo­
getically, “I’m not being unmind­
ful of your hardship. But, I’m just 
trying to correlate the fact that 
you are a widow, yet you have a 
poor sick husband in the hospital.”

♦ WORTH WHILE ♦ 
COMMENTS

McMurry College 
In Campaign For 
$1,750,000.00

No campaign in the history of 
The Methodist Church in West 
Texas and New Mexico has ever 
met with such approval and gen­
eral response as has the $1,750,000 
Endowment and Building Fund 
Campaign for McMurry College, 
which is now under headway in 
this area. To ask of the Church an 
Endowment Fund of $1,000,000.00 
for a college, and at the same time 
to build four great new buildings 
at a cost of $750,000.00 is unprece­
dented in both magnitude and 
vision for the possibilities of a 
Christian Educational Institution.

In response to a recommenda­
tion of President Harold G. Cooke, 
to the Board of Trustees of the 
College last Commencement, plans Texas Experiment Station indi-

BY COUNTY AGENT 
Charles O. Reed 

♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ A *
HYBRID CORN

One of the best means to obtain 
higher corn yields per acre is by 
the use of hybrid corn. The pro­
duction of hybrid corn for seed 
purposes has been expanding 
rapidly for the past several years. 
In 1943 approximately 1,800 acres 
were certified by Texas growers. 
Approximately 30,000 bushels 
were produced which should en­
able Texas farmers to plant 250,- 
000 acres to hybrid corn in 1944. 
This is only about 5% of Texas 
corn acreage. Hybrid corn seed are 
in demand and orders for seed 
should be placed now.

Results for past three years at

were laid, and a vigorous cultiva­
tion was begun for the conduct of 
such a campaign. Both the im­
portance and magnitude of the 
program caught the imagination 
of the Methodist people of West 
Texas and New Mexico. The An­
nual Conferences and District 
Meetings endorsed the program, 
and Conference allotments, Dis­
trict Quotas, and Church goals 
were voluntarily set to cover the 
entire amount To date, approxi­
mately one-half of the amount has

COTTON GINNING 
REPORT

According to W. M. Patman, 
Special Agent the Census report 
shows that 8,409 bales of cotton 
were ginned in Donley County 
from the crop of 1943 prior to 
Jan. 16, 1944 as compared with 
14,122 bales for the crop of 1942.

Ration Reminder
SUGAR—Stamp No. 30 in book 

four is good for 5 pounds through 
March 31. '

MEATS and FATS— Book III, 
R, S, T, U, expired January 29. 
“V” became valid January 23 and 
expires February 26. “W" became 
valid January 30 and is good 
through February 26. "X” becom­
es valid February 6 and is good 
through February 26. "Y” becomes 
valid February 13 through March 
20th.

PROCESSED FOODS—Book IV 
green stamps G, H and J expire 
February 20.

TIRE INSPECTION—“A” book 
holders before March 31, 1944; “B” 
before Feb. 29. 1944; “C” Feb. 29, 
1944; and “T”, every six months 
or every 5,000 miles, whichever 
comes first. •

GASOLINE—(Coupons must be 
endorsed on front). “A” coupons, 
3 gals, each, with No. 9 coupon ex 
piring Jan. 21, 1944. In B-2 and 
C-2 books issued effective Dec 1, 
the coupons nationally have a 
value of 5 gals. each. Other B and 
C coupons, including B-l and C-l, 
still outstanding will retain their 
two-gallon value. “R” and “T \  
five gals, each, “D” one and one- 
half gals, each; and “E” one gal. 
each.

Bond Quota Passes 
Half-Way Mark

War Bond buying still lags in 
Donley county quota although 
there is approximately half the 
drive left to raise the needed 
$134,020.20 to put us over the top.

Workers expressed concern over 
the slow progress being made in 
some districts, but added the hope

McKnight is having a rally Fri­
day night of this week. Hedley is 
having its rally next week. Bray 
and Giles are seeing their citizens 
personally.

that the series of bond rallies and 
other activities scheduled during 
the coming week would bring in­
creased enthusiasm.

DR. HAROLD G. COOKE 
President McMurry College 

Abilene. Texas

BROTHERS MEET UP 
IN ENGLAND

When two brothers meet here at 
home - - • well that isn’t much to 
talk about ;\w t w » n  two brothers 
meet each other after months of 
separation and on foreign soil at 
that - - - well that is something to 
write home about—and that is ex­
actly what they did.

Sometime during the first part 
of January of this year, Lieut. 
William D. Townson and Sgt- 
Donald C. Townson had the good 
fortune of meeting each other 
somewhere in England. Donald 
has been in England about a year, 
and William about two months.

The brothers are sons of Mr. and 
Mrs. G. D. Towson of Turkey and 
grandsons of Mrs. Alice Townson 
of Clarendon. Both boys lived here 
at one time.

Donald states in his letter that 
he sure would like to see “good old 
Texas again.” Yes they celebrated 
their reunion and topped it off by 
Waving their pictures taken to­
gether.

POLL TAX RECEIPTS 
HIT HIGH PEAK

According to final tabulations of 
the Tax Assessor-Collector office, 
a total of 1,808 receipts were is­
sued up until midnight Jan. 31st. 
This number, compared with the 
total of last year which was 1,341, 
gave an increase of 467.

It seems as though most every­
one is interested in politics this 
year and intend to exercise their 
privilege to vote. It being a main 
election year, also has had some­
thing to do with the big purchase.

Bob Hanks and a friend, Morice 
Thompson of Brownfield, visited 
his parents, Rev. and Mrs. H. W 
Hanks the week end.

been secured in cash, bonds, and 
subscriptions—and work on the 
campaign has just begun in most 
Charges.

The Clarendon District Quota 
has been set at $60,000.00.

From the beginning of the Cam­
paign, the Committee has sug­
gested that Series “F” or “G” 
Bonds be given to the Fund, in 
lieu of cash or subscriptions, thus 
enabling the donors to serve both 
their Country and their Church at 
one and the same time. Donors are 
helping to win the war by pur­
chasing bonds, and helping to pre­
serve the Peace, by building a 
Christian Education Institution to 
produce Christian leadership for 
the crucial years following the 
war.

cate that hybrid corn will produce 
about 20% more corn than regu­
lar corn. Hybrid corn must be 
adapted to area for best results.

For Donley County the only two 
varieties that are recommended at 
this time are:

1. Hybrid corn No. 12—a yellow 
double cross hybrid, rather uni­
form, medium size ear with small 
grain. It is probably the best of 
Texas hybrid corn produced and 
has produced more bushels per 
acre at majority of experiment 
stations except at Lubbock. The 
three year uverage at Lubbock 
was 29.3 bushels per acre.

2. Hybrid corn No. 8 is a yellow 
double cross hybrid, not as gen­
erally adapted over Texas as No. | 
12 but stands up better under 
summer droughts, and produced 
more at Lubbock than other va­
rieties tested. The three year 
average at Lubbock was 31.2 
bushels per acre, and is recom­
mended for central and west Tex­
as. This corn produces a larger 
ear and grain than No. 12 but does 
not produce as uniform ears.

The following recommendations 
are given for hybrid com:

(A) Buy only first year seed 
from certified growers in this 
area.

(B) Varieties recommended are 
Hybrid No. 8 and Hybrid No. 12.

(C) Plant on good com land well 
drained, fertile soil using same 
amount of seed as native corn, 
with stalk every three feet.

(D) Do not plant too early. Ex­
periments prove that the best time 
to plant is about time of last frost. 
Corn planted early is usually lost 
by frost. Hybrid corn grows off 
faster than native corn and usual­
ly stands up under summer 
droughts better.

(E) Since only a limited amount 
of Hybrid seed corn is available, 
orders should be placed immed­
iately.

The County Agent’s Office has 
a list of 1943 Certified Seed grow­
ers in case you desire to order 
seed or to obtain price quotations 
on planting seed.

There have been two districts 
that have already gone over the

top so far and they are Goldston 
and Midway consolidated. These 
district captains are Cleo Woods 
and H. T. Burton. They are stir­
ring up quite a bit of interest in 
the other districts, for they know 
they can do as well as the other 
communities.

Among the big bond buyers so 
far in this drive were the Denver 

I R. R., $10,000; United Fidelity Life 
| Insurance Co., $10,000; Southwest­
ern Life Insurance Co., $5,000; 
Telephone Co., $2,000; Rock Island 
R. R.. $25,000; Foxworth-Galbraith 
Lbr. Co., $1,000 and West Texas 
Utilities Co., $2,000.

The following is a tabulation 
showing how each team or com­
munity is standing at the close of 
business Tues. night of this week.

Name Quota Sales Bal. due Team. Capt.
Sunnyview $ 5,232.50 $ 2.000.00 $ 3,232.50 C. M. Lowry
Giles 5,980.00 862.50 5,117.50 E. H. Watt
Windy Valley 8,222.50 1,250.00 7.972.50 Dr. H. Beck
Fairview 6,727.50 700.00 6,027.50 L. Thompson
Goldston . . . .......  9,717.50 9.825.00 none Cleo Woods
Je rich o .......... .......  7,475.00 4,983.00 2,492.00 F. Thomas
Smith . . . . .  4,485.00 1,000.00 3,485.00 C. A. Crow
£ray 8.222.50 1,250.00 6,972.50 W. H. Clay
Watkins 4.485.00 1.000.00 3,485.00 Frank White
Midway Consolidated 3,737.50 4,200.00 none H. T. Burton
Whitefish . 5,980.00 1,500.00 3.480.00 Guy Wright
Skillet 5,980.00 1,000.00 4,980.00 Chas. Reed
A shtola.......... 14,950.00 8,100.00 6,850.00 J. R. Gillham
Martin ......... 12,707.50 4,000.00 8,707.50 W. Smith
Bairfield 5,232.50 1,200.00 4,032.50 C. B. Morris
Chamberlain 6,727.50 2,100.00 4,627.50 Lee Bell
Hudgins .......  6,727.50 1,000.00 5,727.50 L. Whitlock
McKnight . .. .......  5,232.50 731.25 4,501.25 C. D. Walker
Glen wood 6,727.50 1,000.00 5,727.50 T. Connally
H edley......... 44,850.00 4.662.00 40,188.00 W. Franklin
Lelia Lake . .........  22,425.00 5,000.00 17,425.00 Quinn Aten
Clarendon . . ......... 97,175.00 75,750.00 21,425.00 R. Drennun

To»el Y.^. . . . ,, f! $299,000.00' ♦ 184.979.80 134.020.20

PHYSICIAN INJURED 
IN CAR WRECK

While returning from a business 
trip to Oklahoma City the week 
end, Grover C. Heath had the mis­
fortune to collide with a car at or 
near the highway intersection 
north of Jericho about 8:30 Sun­
day night.

Mr. Heath was accompanied by 
Dr. C. G. Stricklin who was in 
quest of a car on the trip. The 
doctor was injured about the neck 
compelling him to remain at home 
several days. Mr. Heath suffered 
only minor bruises. The entire 
side of the Heath car was “side- 
swiped,” he stated.

The other party, was said to be 
driving a “one-eyed” car, and re­
sided at Erick, Oklahoma. His car 
was slightly damaged.

JIM RILEY NOW 
A GUNNER ABOARD 
S/S POELAU-LAUT

Jm Riley, who was home a few 
days ago on furlough, is now back 
on the West coast where he is a 
gunner aboard the S/S Poelau- 
laut, troop transport ship.

Jim Riley S/lc enlisted in the 
U. S. Navy Sept. 30, 1943. He took 
his boot training in the San Diego 
Training Station and spent four 
weeks in a gunnery mates school 
at Destroyer Base, San Diego, Cali.

Before his enlistment Jim was a 
farmer of the Midway community. 
He is a son of Mrs. H. L. Riley of 
this city.

REV. GEO. M. RICKELS 
TO PREACH SUNDAY 
AT BAPTIST CHURCH

Rev. Geo. M. Rickcls will preach 
here at the local Baptist Church 
Sunday morning and night in 
view of selecting a new pastor for 
the local church. Rev. Rickcls 
comes highly recommended and 
local members are urged to be 
present and hear him.

Rev. E. L. Moody, local pastor, 
has been elected to the State 
Evangelistic Board, an honor 
which comes to but few men in a 
life time. Rev. and Mrs. Moody 
will make their home at' Wichita 
Falls after March 1st. The local 
membership is reluctant to see 
the good pastor and his wife leave 
but rejoice in their good fortune 
and wish them success in their 
new field of endeavor.

POST OFFICE EMPLOYES 
BOOST BOND SALE

The postmaster and the four 
clerks at the local postoffice pur­
chased a total of $3,412.50 of 
bonds, and $377.20 in Savings 
Stamps the past week to boost 
Donley county’s quota of bond 
purchases. Postmaster J. C. Est- 
lack stated Tuesday at the Lions 
luncheon that further purchases 
are possible if necessary for this 
drive that closes the 15th.

RECEIVES GRAPEFRUIT
Imagine his delight when J. H. 

Hurn received a half bushel of 
nice grapefruit from Mrs. Phifer 
Estlack from Gainesville. Florida, 
last week. Mrs. Estlack is a niece 
of Mr. Hum and is a daughter of 
Frank Hum of Henrietta.

ROBT. WELDON WARREN 
MADE SERGEANT

Word from Weldon to his folks 
here states that he was promoted 
Feb. 1st from Corporal to Sergeant 
at the Army Air Base, Frederick, 
Okla., where he has been located 
since the opening of that field.

Weldon’s many friends here will 
share with him this deserved pro­
motion. He is a son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J. A. Warren of this city.

BACK ON FURLOUGH
Leondis Yankee, who was sent 

to San Francisco, Calif., where he 
has been in a hospital, visited his 
wife and other relatives here last 
week. He has been in the Hawaii­
an Islands. Mrs. Yankee accompa­
nied him to San Francisco Mon.

Friends of Mrs. W. T. Clifford 
will be glad to hear she was able 
to be moved home Monday from 
the St. Anthony Hospital in Ama­
rillo where she has been for a 
month.

Dr. B. L. Jenkins left Monday
for a 2 weeks visit at Dallas.

CANNING SUGAR 
NOW AVAILABLE

Housewives may now got five 
pounds of canning sugar by using 
stamp No. 40 in ration book four, 
OPA has announced, and addi­
tional canning sugar later will be 
available on application to local 
boards. Stamp No. 40 will be good 
13 months, through Feb. 28, 1945.

4-H Boys Step Up 
Production

Charles Reed, Donley County 
Agent, has received the following 
information from College Station:

Beef calves, sheep and hogs 
which went to market from Texas 
4-H Club boys’ pastures and feed­
ing lots in 1943 were sufficient to 
provide 14,167 fighting men with 
meat for one year.

Sales from these demonstrations 
last year put $1,687,925 into the 
pockets of 40,606 boys enrolled in 
4-H work in the state, according 
to reports compiled by the Texas 
A&M College Extension Service.

This home front campaign was 
carried on by the members of 
4,162 clubs under the supervision 
of their county agricultural agents 
and with the assistance of 3,726 
adult local leaders. But it was 
completed under most difficult 
conditions. On account of the lab­
or shortage, boys took a larger 
share of the routine farm work on 
their shoulders than ever before, 
but the demonstration work went 
on notwithstanding. When they 
were finished, however, the boys 
put on the market 6,022 beef calv­
es, 4,284 sheep and goats, and 
26,269 hogs. In addition there were 
field crops and poultry demonstra­
tions, along with livestock and 
and poultry products—wool, mo­
hair, and eggs.

The year’s production wasn’t all 
hard work. The boys held a total 
of 162 club shows in different 
parts of the state. They exhibited 
8,988 head of livestock and divided 
thousands of dollars in prize mon­
ey and received hundreds of blue, 
red and white ribbons represent­
ing the classes in which their calv­
es, hogs, sheep and goats placed.

The slogan of the 1943 Texas 
4-H Club boys was “feed a fight­
er.” Some had goals to produce 
the equivalent of the food budgets 
of all the men in the service from 
their counties. The 195 club boys 
in Swisher County put so much 
energy into the job that they over­
shot the goal. With 609 men in the 
armed services they produced 
enough to equal the food budget 
for 621 men for one year.

J. A. Warren visited his daugh­
ters in Amarillo Sunday.
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+ LIBRARY NOTES +
♦  By Mrs. C. A. Burton 4
♦  4

Our latest order of new books 
brought us two Pollyanna books: 
“Pollyanna’s Door to Happiness" 
and "Pollyanna’s Golden Horse­
shoe.” These “Glad" books, begun 
long ago, have continued to bring 
courage and gladness to many 
readers. The firtt ones were writ­
ten by Eleanor H. Porter. After 
her death Harriet Lummis Smith 
continued the stories and now 
these last ones arc written by 
Elizabeth Barton.

Two other books with which 
we are delighted are of the Silver

Chief dog stories by Jack O’Brien: 
“Silver Chief to the Rescue,” and 
“Silver Chief Returns,” and anoth 
er equally as good dog story, 
"Broken Fang’’ by R. G. Mont­
gomery. Added to these are two 
of Terhunc’s splendid dog stories, 
“Lad of Sunnybank,” and “Furth­
er Adventures of Lad.”

Then for our smaller readers we 
have three of the perennial favor­
ites, the Bobbsey Twins by Laura 
Lee Hope—“The Bobbsey Twins 
at the Ice Carnival,” “The Bob­
bsey Twins in the Land of Cot­
ton,” and “The Bobbsey Twins in 
Echo Valley.” Two other books 
which these younger readers will 
enjoy are “Ashkee of Sunshine 
Water: a Navajo Indian Boy", and 
"All Through the Night" by 
Rachel Field.

A FEED for EVERY NEED
When you need any kind of feed for stock or poultry bo 
euro to Inspect our stock, for we guarantee it to bo good.

Custom Grinding
Wo are equipped to do your grinding any way you 
It done. Profit more by grinding.

Thomas Mill & F eed Store
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Then for the “grown-ups" there 
are a few new westerns: “Riders 
Across the Border,” Jackson Greg­
ory: “Rifled Gold,” W. C. Tuttle; 
“Bucky Follows a Cold Trail,” 
Wiliam McLeod Raine; “Parson of 
Panamint,” Peter B. Kyne; “Chip 
of the Flying U", Bower—replac­
ing a worn out .copy; “Freckles 
Comes Home" by Gene Stratton 
Porter is also a replacement, and 
these which follow are by favor­
ite authors: “China Sky”, Pearl 
Buck; “The Lucky Lawrences," 
Kathleen Norris; “Nurses Are 
People,” Louise Platt Hauck; 
"Workaday Lady,” Maysie Greig; 
"War Wife,” Renee Shann; "The 
Wagon and the Star,” Lida Larri- 
more; "The Search,” Grace Liv­
ingstone Hill; “The Crystal Tree,” 
Hauck; “I Wanted Wings,” Beirne 
Lay; "Cloudy Jewell,” Grace L. 
Hill; “You Can’t Take It With 
You,” a drama by Hart and Kauf­
man.

Quite often our friends pass on 
a book to us. Recently Bob Clif­
ford gave us an aviation story for 
boys and the Book Club gave us 
“Generation of Vipers.” Another 
addition to our shelves is a slender 
volume called “Thoughts In 
Verse” by Mrs. Sarah Ellen Hall 
of Hedley, a former Clarendon 
resident who will be remembered 
by many of our people. These 
charming "Thoughts” will be en­
joyed by her friends.

Walt Disney’s film version of 
De Seversky’s "Victory Through 
Air Power” has scored one of his 
greatest successes. The book led 
the best-sellers in non-fiction for 
quite a long time.

Deep regret was felt by his 
reading public at the news of the 
death of William Allen White at 
his home in Emporia, Kansas a 
few days ago. “The Sage of Em­
poria" had left his impress on the 
life of the nation in many ways 
during his life of 76 years. His 
books and short stories as well as 
his editorials have influenced pub­
lic thinking and no book for 
months past has been more popu­
lar than “They Were Expendable,” 
written by William Allen White’s 
son, W. L. White. Another best 
seller by this same one who is fol­
lowing in his father's footsteps is 
“Queens Die Proudly,” a story of 
air warfare.

The statement has been made 
that the first edition of the forth- 

i coming “Letters of Alexander 
Woolloott” will run to 50.000

I copies.

HOW TO SAVE SHIRT MONEY
A N D  B U Y M O R I 

W AR BONDS

— C O M I N G  —
February 12- 14th 

Mary Martin and Dick Powall 
in “TRUE TO LIFE"

COZY THEATRE
SATURDAY ONLY 

FEBRUARY 5
Hop Along Cassidy

“BAR 20”
Chapter 8 at 

THE BLACK DRAGON" 
Adm. 11-20c

IN THE COUNTY COURT 
OF

DONLEY COUNTY, TEXAS
IN THE MATTERS OF THE 
GUARDIANSHIP OF No. 697 
OBRA GERALD SPIER,
A MINOR
THE STATE OF TEXAS

To all persons interested in the 
estate of Obra Gerald Spier take 
notice that Odis H. Spier did on 
the 31st day of January, 1944, file 
in the County Court of Donley 
County, Texas, his petititon and 
account for final settlement pray­
ing for discharge as guardian of 
said Obra Gerald Spier alleging 
the death of the said Obra Gerald 
Spier on or about the 30th day of 
November, 1942, while serving in 
the armed service of the United 
States Government and in the 
United States Navy and that a 
hearing on said application will be 
heard by the County Judge of 
Donley County, Texas, at ten 
o'clock a. m. on Monday, Febru­
ary 21st., 1944, in his office in the 
Court House, Clarendon, Texas, at 
which time and place all matters 
concerning said guardianship will 
be heard.

Given under my hand and seal 
of said court in office at Clarendon 
this the 31st. day of January A. D. 
1944 and issued the same date.

HELEN WIEDMAN, 
Clerk of County Court, 
Donley County, Texas. 

(SEAL) By Walker Lane, Deputy
(52-c)

♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

J H U D G I N S
♦ Mrs. S. M. Harp
4

There was only a few out for 
Sunday school and singing Sun.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Aufill and 
daughter spent Saturday night 
and Sunday in the J. L. Talley 
home.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Perdue Jr. 
and son spent Saturday night and 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. John 
Perdue.

Herschel Thompson was down 
from Dumas Sunday visiting in 
this community.

Melvin Fowlkes spent Saturday

Can Vitamins Restore 
GRAY HAIR?

WHAT WOULD a wounded aoldier 
think of you if he could hear 

you aay: “I can’t afford to buy an 
extra War Bond?”

Ha might remind you that he 
couldn’t "afford” to go to wart But 
ha went, and now ha’a making mora 
aacrifices . . .  for you. No wonder he 
•xpecte you to do something that will 
halp him!

Eepecially when all you’re asked to 
do is to buy an extra $100 War Bond 
thia month. So check over your bud­
get . . .  tee if you can’t awing at least 
an extra $100 . . .  or $200 . . .  or $300 
. . .  or even $500 for extra War Bonds. 
You’ll find that you can . . . and it’a 
no sacrifice, either, for War Bonds 
are the beat investment in the world 
today I

J. A. WARREN
AGENCY

INSURANCE •  BONDS

Bryan Clothing Co.
MEN’8 WEAR

Two Variety Shorts

TUESDAY ONLY 
FEBRUARY 8

LON CHANEY Jr. •

“Son of Dracula”
Scroon Snapshot

Fox News

night and Sunday with Sidney 
Harp.

Mr. and Mrs. L. C. Tims, Velma 
and Clyde spent Sunday afternoon 
in the John Perdue home.

Mrs. J. E. West visited in Ama­
rillo last week.

Mr. and Mrs. D. B. Perdue spent 
Saturday night and Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Talley and family

Mr. and Mrs. Othel Elliott and 
children of Clarendon spent Sun­
day with Mr. and Mrs. Otto Elliott 
and family.

T. E. Perdue of Amarillo spent 
Friday night in the John Perdue 
home.

Mr. and Mrs. John Fowlkes, 
Laura Ann and Margaret took 
Sunday dinner with Mr. and Mrs. 
O. L. Jacobs.

Mr. and Mrs. Alton Webb, Eloys 
and Earmalea Elliott, Mary Nell 
Perdue, Weldon Webb, Junior 
Mann, Bill Perdue, Imogene El­
liott, Joyce West and Jerry Per­
due, Dan Tims took Sunday din­
ner with Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Tal­
ley and family.

Frederick Bandy visited with 
Sidney Harp Sunday afternoon.

Ben Talley spent Saturday night 
with Bill Perdue.

L. C. Tims made a business trip 
to Dumas Tuesday.

Mrs. Jack Foster and children 
and Mr .and Mrs. Lacy Noble and 
son Jackie and Melvin Fowlkes 
took Sunday dinner with Mr. and 
Mrs. Harp and son.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Bandy mov­
ed to our community last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Foster visit­
ed in this community Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. William Meador 
and family visited awhile Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. O. D. Meador.

Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Wood and 
son of Clarendon called in the 
Perdue home Sunday night

Odell Davis who is in school at 
New York, came by plane for a 
few days visit with his parents, 
Mr and Mrs. Tullia Davis.

Dr. J. Gordon Stewart
PHYSICIAN A SURGEON

Office in Latson Bldg. 

Ground Floor 
Office Phone 238 

Residence Phone 253

PASTIME
THEATRE

Continuous Show Each Saturday 
Beginning at 2:00 p. m.

Two Shows Sunday 
Beginning at 2 and 4 p. m. 

Other Days Three Shows Daily 
Beginning at 5:30—7:30—0:30 

Admission Every Day 
Except Tuesday U-30c (Tax Inc* 

Bargain Day Tuesday ll-15e

FRIDAY AND SATURDAY 
FEBRUARY 4-5 

John Wayne and Martha Scott

“In Old Oklahoma”
Color Cartoon

SATURDAY FREYUE 
SUNDAY A MONDAY

FEBRUARY 5-7

Douglas • Goldston Drug Co.

I. S. JAMESON
LIVESTOCK AND FARM

AUCTIONEER
For Dates phone me at

Colonial Apt. 20132 Pierce S t 
Amarillo. Texas

You can save shirt money by making your shirts last 
longer. Follow these 8 conservation tips, and youll have 
more money to land Uncle Sami

J Before laundering, turn shirt collars up. This re­
duces rubbing along top edge.

2  Soak badly soiled ships overnight in light soap 
solution. This eliminates heavy scrubbing. Give 
shirts three hot rinses. >

2  Use very little starch and bleaching. No starch for 
non-wilt collars; no bleaching for colored shifts.

4  If you’re a needle expert, turn a collar when it frays.
g  Give extra-long sleeves s tuck. This saves cuffs from 

fraying.
6  Clip the edges off frayed cuffs and stitch edgd again.
J  Look for the “Sanforized” label when buying a 

new shirt. “Sanforized’’-UbeIed shirts won’t shrink 
even \%.

g  Save buttons and usable material on shirts you are 
about to discard.

WEDNESDAY - THURSDAY 
A FRIDAY, FEB. 9-10-11

V1*

HUM  BACK TH E ATTAC K!

FARMERS STATE BANK
MEMBER FEDEBAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION

NOTARY PUBLIC

COMPLETE INCOME TAX 
S E R V I C E  

(25 years' experience)

Social Security k Withholding 
Tax Reports

FREE CONSULTATION
Offices: Goldston Building, 

Clarendon, Texas

so tu ssex

SEM E DOOR
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♦  THE TEMPI! Of TRUTH ♦
♦  • ♦
♦  By tbo Apootta ♦
♦  ♦

VACATION.
Some folk* stage a vacation by 

spending a month on the sands, 
then come home and go on the 
rocks for 11 months.

..PATRIOTIC!
“Sweet Adeline” is the bottle 

hymn of the Republic.

ANCESTRY.
Thrift is a wonderful 

especially in an ancestor.
virtue;

sons o r  - - ?t
No, not that this time. But since 

Germany is being bombed daily, 
why not quit calling those birds

Nazis and call them “Sons of 
Blitzes!!!"

♦  ♦  ♦  
HISTORICAL.

’Member way back when half 
the men folks carried their broken 
arms in slings from trying to 
crank a jitney with the spark too 
far advanced?

♦  ♦  ♦
INDOOR SPORTS.

When the average man argues

with a woman, the final result is 
that “he came, he saw, and he 
concurred.”

♦  ♦  ♦

WEAKLY POME.
She hiked to the butcher 

For spare ribs and suet,
But found the other gal 

Had beat her tuet.
She pulled a paw and beller 

When the butcher said 
He had nothing to sell her.

HERSHEYS COCOA
Vi Pound..................................................... 10c
DRIED APRICOTS
Vz Pound...................................................... 15c
MUSTARD
1 Quart . . .................................................. 11c
SARDINES
Oval, in Tomato Sauco—2 Cans .............. 35c
BIRD SEED
Slag Sing—2 Boxes .................................. 25c
TOMATO JUICE
4Vi os. Can—1 Cans .................................. 29c

OLEOMARGARINE
• • •  •

SLAB BACON
Pound 32c

DICED CARROTS
II Vi os. Jar—2'for 25c

HOT BARBECUE
Pound ......  30c

Shortening — .59
SYRUP—Pure Cane 

Gallon J a r .......................$£19
1 BEANS—Green Cut 
j Standard—3cans...........3 5 C

1 QCroJUK - 1
COFFEE—Schillings

2Pounds.......................6 3 C
SOAP—Crystal White 

61argeBars.................. 2 5 C

DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT
Silk Crepe & Satin Gowns. .$3® 5 Men’s Dress Shirts......$1 6 9  up

WHITE and FANCY “
Crepe & Satin Slips...... 51 49u
LADIES ™ p Mens Work Pants & Shirts $|29 up

Ladies Pajamas...........$ 2 ^ 9  u P *len s Work Sox........1 8 C UP

Brassieres............... 3 9 C 11P *lens Rain Coats............ $075

Queen Lace Hose......Q Q r  u
ALSO MESH

P *loy’s Corduroy Hats........$£98

LADIES

SMOCKS
All sisoa

BATH and BEDROOM

RUGS
All sixes and colors

BOY'S DRESS

OXFORDS
AU sixes

MEN'S DRESS

OXFORDS
AU sixas

$£98 $£ 2 5  up $ £ 9 8  up $2 9 8  up

FARMERS EXCHANGF
*  GROCERIES & MARKET “

Phone 63-J W E D E L I V E R Phone 63-J

She pleaded for hog chops, 
Even dog meat or mutton;

The butcher said: “Lady,
I’m even out of nuttin’.”

♦ ♦  ♦
Now is the time to hunt up a 

fellow who plows gardens and 
hauls fertilizer. Know of any one 
that is interested in making mon­
ey on our war garden on the start?

A S H T O L A
Mrs. Dick Tomlinson

Everett Parker of California and 
Mrs. Hall Hardin of Amherst 
visited Mr. and Mrs. S. G. Evans 
Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Lu McClellan vis­
ited their son Johnnie Rex at 
Turkey Sunday.

Fred Hill has recently moved to 
Lclia Lake. Mr. Hill having been 
assigned there by the F.W. & D.

Sgt. and Mrs. Eulen Higdon left 
Saturday for Laredo, where Eulen 
is stationed and Mrs. Higdon is 
connected with the school system.

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Debord and 
daughter of Pampa are visiting 
Burk Deboard and family.

Johnnie Ferguson and wife 
moved to Amarillo th«j past week*

Mrs. Gargis was brought home 
from the local hospital Monday. 
Her condition is improved.

Pfc. T. A. Nelson and wife left 
last week for San Antonio to visit 
Pvt. and Mrs. Willard Cook.

Norman Kuykendall is visiting 
in Amarillo.

Mrs. Murle Thompson Is in Cle­
burne with her grandfather who 
is ilL

Sunday was the occasion for the 
celebration of H W. Lovell’s 70th 
birthday. Mr. Lovell was fortunate 
to have all his children present 
with the exception of H. W. Jr. 
who is serving with our armed 
forces overseas, also all the grand­
children were present.

E. C. Dewey and wife shopped 
in Amarillo Wednesday.

Mrs. J. M. Graham visited her 
son, Doyce and family of Claren-
♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦ 

News for you 
about the WAC
WANT TO KNOW how tho 
now WAC recruiting poli­
cies apply to you?

Want to know whether 
you're qualified for a spec­
ial kind of Army job 
whether you'd serve with 
the Air. Ground, or Service 
Forces—whether you could 
be assigned to the part of 
th# country in which you 
enlist?
TODAY—get full details at 
the nearest U. S. Army Re­
cruiting Station (your local 
post office will yivo you the 
address). Or write to: The 
Adjutant General. Ro o m  
4415, Munitions Building, 
Washington, D. C.

Easy te apply. Quick to 
Stops “pink eye" loses*. A H  
bottle—enough to treat M to 49 
cases 11.00.

Calf Prescription 
For the treatment e< 
diarrhea. A time tasted 
Oats th* job done. Large 
4R ounce* -11.00.

Sulfa Powder 
A sulfa drug preparatton 
animal wound*. Promotes prompt 
healing. Convenient 
1% ounce* |1.00.

are made by practical cab 
tie people, tarted In their own 
hard, and gnstawlni  to gal tba 
jab dana In yearn We are proud 
to be tho exclusive agency hi 
our town for this line of out­
standing original produato. Drop 
to any time and let us show 
them to you and

Douglas-Goldston 
Drug Co.

THE REXALL STORE 
Phonu 36

don Saturday.
Mr. and Mrs. Lester Joyner of 

Amarillo visited relatives here 
Sunday.

Pfc. Norris Dewey of Army Air 
Base of Pampa visited his par­
ents over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Marti Mason of 
Levelland visited here Sunday. 
Mrs. Mason is remaining with her 
parents for a visit.

Adkins Mace and family spent 
the week end in the home of Mrs. 
A. L. Wallace.

Charline Knox shopped in Ama­
rillo Saturday.

T. B. Nelson of Claude is visit­
ing Arthur Nelson this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Butler of 
Burger were visiting here Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. R. R. Ray had 
business in Amarillo Monday.

W. W. Buck has gone to points 
in East Texas for an extended 
visit.

Laura Mae Harp and Mrs. Murl 
Thompson of Amarillo visited 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. B. 
Harp, Sunday.

Mrs. Millard Word visited her 
mother, Mrs. Ingham flf Canyon, 
also Bob who is attending W.T. 
S.C.

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC
You may secure 1943 Income 

Tax Forms at this office without 
cost or obligation. The Treasury 
Department furnishes us these 
forms for distribution. Glad to 
furnish those who desire to make 
up their own reports.

If you desire our services in 
compiling your reports, our fees, 
generally, are as follows:

Form 1065, Partnerships, $5 up.
Form 1040, Personals, $5 up.
Form 1040A, Personals, salaries 

only, $2.50 up.
J. A. WARREN 
Income Tax Service, 
Goldston Bldg., 
Clarendon, Texas.

(48tfc)

E. L. King of Amarillo visited 
in the Frank Bourland home Mon.

AT FIRST 
SIGN OF A

C a V®
- use 6 6 6

16 6  TABLETS. SALVE. NOSE DROPS

ABSTRACTS •  LOANS
and REAL ESTATE

*
Donley County Abstract Company 

C. E. KILLOUGH 
Phone 44

Personal
Satisfaction
You’ll be pleased as anything at the grand appear­
ance of the clothes you send in to us for cleaning 
and pressing.

We don’t do the luxury services that we 
used to take pride in giving—but for every-day 
quality work we’re still giving the best!

Like Everyone Else, We’re Short of 
H elp — So A llow  Us P lenty of 

Time to Do Our Best I

PARSONS BROS.
THE MASTER CLEANERS

Phone 27

Our Goal —  
The Very Best

BANKING
SERVICE

This Bank strives at all times to 
provide the best banking service 
that is humanly possible for all of 
its customers.

We always try to be friendly and 
helpful, remembering that our 
FIRST OBLIGATION is the pro- j 
tection of funds our depositors 
have entrusted to our care.

Men, women and children of the 
community are cordially invited 
to make use of the complete and 
modern financial services avail­
able here. Your every require­
ment will be given courteous at­
tention.

ry > N L E Y  C O U N T V
• J  STATE BANK I

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

J a y  p r o m p t l y  •  k e e p  y o u r  c r e d it  g o o d
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Phone 495
CATALDO—HAYES

Miss Carmeta Cataldo of Buf­
falo, New -York and S/Sgt. Jack 
Hayes of Boston, Mass., son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Hayes of Claren­
don, were married Tuesday, Janu­
ary 25, at 8 p. m. in the home of 
his parents with the ring cere­
mony with Rev. M. F. Manchester 
officiating. The matron of honor 
was Mrs. Joe Hayes and the 
groom’s attendant was the groom’s 
brother, Joe Hayes of Pampa. The 
bride wore a navy blue dress with 
white accessories. The flowers and 
corsages were of carnations and 
gladioli.

The groom graduated from the 
Clarendon College and is now in 
Boston in the service. Mrs. Hayes 
attended the High School of Buf­
falo and is a riveter in the Bell 
Aircraft Factory in Buffalo.

Mr. and Mrs. Hayes left Tues­
day for Buffalo.

Those attending the wedding 
were his aunt, Mrs. Myrtle Siddle 
and daughter, Juanell and cousin, 
Clara Jo Hayes of Memphis, Mrs. 
Eva Phelps and R. I. McGowan.

Junior College. She has been em­
ployed by the Santa Fe Railroad 
Company.

Pfc. Earl attended Hay Springs 
High School in Chadron, Neb. He 
is now stationed at Amarillo Army 
Air Field .

Immediately after the marriage 
ceremony, Pfc. and Mrs. Earl left 
for a wedding trip to Oklahoma 
City. After Feb. 1 they will be at 
horn 3 at 1119 Harrison Street.

HESTER—EARL
Announcement has been made 

of the marriage of Miss Cymantha 
Hester, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Hester of Clarendon and 
Pfc. Vernon L. Earl, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Rex Earl of Chadron, 
Neb.

Vows were exchanged in a 
double ring ceremony at 8 o’clock 
Friday evening. Jan. 21, in the 
home of the officiating minister, 
Dr. A. D. Foreman, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church in Amarillo. 
The couple were attended by Miss 
Jo Nell Stogner and Pfc. Johnie 
Stinette.

The bride wore a navy blue suit 
with hat and gloves to match.

Mrs. Earl lived in Clarendon 
and was graduated from the Clar­
endon High ̂ school and Clarendon

PATHFINDER CLUB
Friday, the Pathfinder Club en­

joyed a social afternoon with some 
of their friends in the home of 
Mrs. Pete Kunz, on their thirty 
third anniversary. The co-hostess­
es were Mesdames U. J. Boston, 
Harold Phelps, Carl Allmond, 
Walker Lane, Earnest Hunt, Fred 
Buntin.

The theme for the program was 
patriotism. Mrs. Frank White read 
a tribute to the flag and to our 
nation. Misses Billy Kidd, Kitty 
Ruth Baley and Mrs. Caroll Hud­
son sang patriotic songs.

Our national colors were used in 
the decorations in the dining 
room. White vines twined among 
tall white tapers burning on the 
table laid with an embroidered 
white cloth. Red and blue satin 
ribbons were festooned around the 
table caught up with clusters of 
red carnations. The tea service 
was at one end of the table and at 
the opposite end on a reflector 
stood a large white eagle looking 
down into her white nest which 
received a liberal offering for the 
U.S.O.

During the afternoon ninety 
ladies registered in the guest book.

IRA JEAN ESTLACK 
HONORED ON 12th 
BIRTHDAY

Ira Jean Estlack was honored 
with a formal theatre-dinner party 
Friday evening by her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Estlack, the 
occasion being her 12th birthday

A pink and blue color scheme 
was used in flowers and other dec­
orations. The dining table was 
covered with a lace cover with 
the large pink cake with pink 
candles as centerpiece. Pink and 
blue tapers in crystal holders were 
at each side of the cake. Pink 
gladiolus centered the small ta­
bles.

The guests arrived at 6 o’clock. 
Games were played until 7 when 
dinner was served. After dinner 
the show "A Lady Takes a 
Chance” was enjoyed at the Pas­
time Theatre.

Many nice and beautiful gifts 
were received by the honoree.

Guests were Jaunita Carpenter, 
Lama V Tatum, Scharlean Pyeatt, 
Arvazene Smith, Margaret Mose- 
ly, Mary Ladell Cox, Patricia and 
Barbara Estlack, Bobby Beard, 
Douglas Shelton, Bennie Pyeatt, 
Tommy Murphy, Buster Bain, 
Gene Bryan, Bob Clifford and the 
honoree, Ira ^ a n  Estlack, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. C. Estlack, Mr. and Mrs. 
Vada Carpenter.

IJred Molesworth, who was un­
able to attend, sent a gift.

Assisting in serving was Mrs. 
J. C. Estlack, Mrs. Vada Carpen­
ter, Patricia and Barbara Estlack.

B. A. U. SOCIAL
The B. A. U. of the Baptist 

church met in a social and cover­
ed dish dinner at the home of Mrs. 
Leona Jones. Sixteen members 
were present.

1926 BOOK CLUB
The 1926 Book Club met Tues­

day afternoon in the home of Mrs. 
M. R. Allensworth with Mesdames 
C. W. Bennett and Walter Clifford 
assisting as hostesses.

At the business meeting, Mrs. 
J. R. Porter, the parliamentarian, 
reviewed to the club some of the 
Constitution and By-laws that are 
apt to be overlooked, also $10 was 
voted to be given to the City 
Library fund.

Mrs. L. T. Shelton presented the 
book "Lady In Waiting,” by Rary 
Gallagher, which was very inter­
estingly reviewed by Mrs. C. M. 
Lowry. This book is written in 
form of a diary, and is very clever, 
frank and humorous.

The attractive spacious rooms

Look Ahead 
To Spring Now

were decorated with cyclomen 
and beautiful vase of carnations.

The hostesses served delicious 
refreshments of congealed salad, 
hot rolls, tarts, tea and coffee to 
seventeen active members, six as­
sociate members and Mesdames 
Northcutt of Dallas, Howze, Kunz, 
Turner, Carroll Knorpp and Tho­
mas of Clarendon as guests.

The next meeting will be the 
Husband’s Party which will be 
held in the Home Economics Dept. 
January 15th .

WOMANS SOCIETY 
CHRISTIAN SERVICE

The Womans Society of Christ­
ian Service met Wednesday after­
noon in the Methodist Church in 
the regular monthly business 
meeting with 28 present.

Mrs. J. R. Bulls gave the devo­
tional. We will meet next Wed­
nesday afternoon with the'Ladies 
Auxiliary at the Presbyterian 
church. A program on inter-racial 
relations will be given.

—Reporter

ASHTOLA NEEDLE CLUB
The Ashtola Needle Club met 

Thursday afternoon in the Club 
room. The usual needle work, 
visiting and a short program of 
games were enjoyed.

The hostesses, Mrs. Chas. Harp 
and W. A. Poovey, served delic­
ious refreshments of pie and cof­
fee to members, Mesdames M. 
Miller, Joe Bownds, F. M. Wat­
kins, G. J. Hinders, W. P. Holley, 
Chester Myers, Lu McClellan, J. 
M. Graham, H. S. Mahaffey, H. W. 
Lovell, E. C. Dewey, Hubert 
Rhoades, J. R. Brandon.

1930 NEEDLE CLUB
Several hours of needle work 

and visiting were enjoyed when 
Hattie Palmer entertained this 
club at her home Tuesday after­
noon.

In the late afternoon, the host­
ess, Mrs. Palmer, served a lovely 
salad plate refreshment to guest, 
Marie Patterson and club mem­
bers Mozelle Wright, Maggie 
Hunt, Nora Decker, Alice Bain, 
Marguerite Carpenter, Marie Bell, 
Mary Wallace and Hattie Palmer.

ASSEMBLY OF OOD CHURCH 
J. J. Grubb*. Pastor

Sunday school—10 a. m. 
Preaching—11 a. m. and 8:45 p.m. 
Prayer Meeting, Wed.—7:30 p. m.

PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
OF JESUS CHRIST 

P. A. Lindlay. Pastor
You are cordially invited to at­

tend our services.
Sunday School—10:30 a. m. 
Preaching—11:30 a. m.

WINDY VALLEY 
NEEDLE CLUB

The Windy Valley Needle Club 
met January 26th with four mem­
bers present. One quilt was quilt­
ed for the Red Cross. Mrs. Cap 
Anderson will be hostess at the 
next meeting, Feb. 9th.

EPISCOPAL CHURCH OF 
ST. JOHN BAPTIST 

Raw. Frank H. Hutchins. M. A . 
Clergyman

Mr. Walter B. Knorpp,
Lay Raador

Sunday, February 6th 
Septuagcsima
11 a. m.—Holy Communion and 

Sermon.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
L. Guy Ament, Pastor

The Roll Call day last Sunday 
was a good day. Everyone seemed 
to enjoy the hour.

Next Sunday services at 11 a.m. 
Sunday school at 10 a. m. Remem­
ber this is Orphan Home day. The 
offering goes to the Juliette Fow­
ler Homes. Evening service will 
be at 6 p. m. We cordially invite 
and welcome everyone.

Home Ec. Dept.
By Billie Jean Knox

The old Home Ec. Department 
has been buzzin* like a bee hive 
this semester, what with the fresh­
man girls from Jr. High joining 
the Sophomore girls in their first 
year, and the Red Cross work and 
Home Nursing the second year 
girls have been taking.

In the first unit of the semester 
the first year girls took up "Good 
Grooming.” And believe me, they 
learned how to be and look like 
real ladies. Well, anyway, they 
were supposed to.

The second unit provided the 
knowledge of making homes more 
livable. (Starting in young, aren't 
you girls) They had gobs of fun. 
In all their home project*, they 
made 74 garments, 3 clothes clos­
ets, 184 coasters and hot pads, and 
about 20 holders for the coasters.

In their third unit, they took up 
clothing construction. T h a t’s 
where the headaches started. Of 
all the fitting and basting, sewing, 
then ripping, sewing again (yep, 
then ripping again,) you never 
saw the like. But they finally 
made it. And come spring, just 
watch those 50 new dresses blos­
som out. Although the second year 
girls hate to say it, these girls real­
ly beat them in selecting designs 
and in appearance of the finished 
dress.

The second year girls have done 
some good work too. Two weeks 
after school opened, they started a 
six-weeks Home Nursing course, 
and did they have fun! It was 
amazing to see how much know­
ledge they gained and to find out 
how little they really knew about 
caring for the sick. After the 
course was finished, twenty girls 
received their Red Cross certifi­
cates, and were they proud of 
them. They had reason to be. The 
course was no snap. It required 
much study and practice.

After the Nursing course was
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finished, the girls took up Red 
Croaa work.-They made 53 Christ­
mas trees and 135 nut cups for 
little favors to go on the hospital 
trays for the wounded in service. 
Also for the service men, they 
made 110 calendars for 1944, 70* 
address books, 40 talley cards, 10 
score pads, all out of book binders 
trimmings, of different designs 
and colors. ,

They blockprinted a design on 
the corners of 1000 napkins for the 
service men. These were designs 
for different holidays as Christ­
mas, New Year, Easter, S t Pat­
rick, and two kinds of patriotic 
designs. These block prints are 
made by cutting a design into a 
piece of linoleum then inking a- 
round the design and pressing it 
on the napkins. It is very pretty 
on them.

The girls made 3 bridge table 
covers and 46 sewing kits. The kits 
contained 2 spools of thread (black 
and white), 2 needles, 6 buttons, 
and 6 safety pins. (The boys will 
probably use the safety pins first, 
then, if it is a case of have to, the 
needles, thread and buttons).

Before Christmas, the girls 
made a five pound apple sauce 
cake for the guards at the prison 
camp at McLean. It was whispered 
around that the guards forced the 
prisoners to eat i t  No, really girls, 
it was a delicious looking cake.

The girls just gulped the work 
down about nutrition. They al­
most stuck on those things called 
vitamins, but they managed to 
wade through. And just watch 
those gals dish out the nutritous, 
hot meals. You’d better grab one 
of those little ladies, boys. They’re 
a real catch.

The girls, taking all the bums, 
cuts, misfits, needlepricks, and 
bastings in their stride, had lots of 
fun and accomplished an apprec­
iable amount of work the first 
semester in Home Ec.

Clarence May was down from 
Pantex Mondav.

In Our Market
QUALITY MEATS

AT NO EXTRA COST
Try out Grain fad Baby 
Baaf lor your naxt maal— 
thara’s a diffaraaca.

•  HOT BARBECUE
•  CHEESE SPREADS
•  LUNCH MEAT

•  SWEET PICKLES

P ound .............(

CLARENDON
^  FOOD STORE
GROCERIES &  M A R K ET

a „, ,X*L

Pork Roast
L A R D  = “ .1 8
F lo u r
C risco  » -v .7 5

SILVER PEAK

Guaranteed to plaasa 
41 lb. S a c k .............. $ 2 .2 5

SPINACH
Dal Monta
Glass Jar

1 8 c
PEAS

Dal Mont*
303 Can
(• points)

17c
PRUNES

Fraah
Gallon Can

(41 points

59c

ORANGES
Texas

POUND

$16.95 up
Foresighted fashion "buy” 
for thru Spring! Classic suit 
plus matching topcoat — 
smart anywhere, anytime — 
together or separately! See 
the whole advance group 
today! 12-20.

News! Color-Bright 
SPRING  C O A T  C A S U A LS

from $1695
Color makes headline news for your go-everywhere, 
all-purpose Spring coat! Tops over your suits, 
prints, dresses now thru Spring — wonderful for 
warmer climates! Smooth wrap coats, reefers, boy 
coats, casuals, Shetlands, fleeces, in Spring’s newest 
colors. Misses, women.

Grapefruit
Taxaa

POUND

E  N
DRY GOODS COMPANY

SPUDS
Larga White

* V'
15 lbs.

59c

PICKLES
Sour or Dill—Gallon Glass J a r....... 95c
PORK & BEANS
Marshall—22 os. Can ................................

• * • • * 

15c
SYRUP
Old Plantation—No. 2 C an....................... 19 c
C0C0ANUT
Shredded—14 oa. C an................................ 49c
KRAUT
BULK—2 lb*. for ..................................... 25c
OATS
Brlmfull—Larga Box .............................. 29c
WASH0
Largo Box ................................................ 21c

Green Beans

CL0R0X
Vi gallon .............. 29c

No. 2 Can 
(No points) 

2 for

Grapefruit
Juice
No. 2 Can 
(No pointe)

14c
PEACHES

Bun Haven

No. 2 Vi Can

28c
WE DELIVER ^  3UY CREAM. POULTRY, EGGS and HIDES PHONE—43
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F O R  S A L E
PERMANENT W AVE, J * , t  Do

your own Permanent w i t h  
Charm - Kurl Kit. Complete 
equipment, including 40 curlers 
and shampoo. Easy to do, abso­
lutely harmless. Praised by 
thousands including Fay Mc­
Kenzie, glamorous movie star. 
Money refunded if not satisfied. 

Douglas ft Golds ton
(7-p)

WORMS IN SWINE—Now is the 
time to worm pigs. Use Globe 
Phenothiazine in regular feed. 
Buy it at—

Stocking's Drug Store
(50-p)

FOR SALE—1941 Chevrolet Spec- 
al DeLuxe, blue 4-door sedan. 
Good pre-war tires, radio and 
heater. Extra clean. Inquire at 
Alderson Studio. (50-p)

BULK SULPHUR—For sale in 
5-pound bags, only 25 cents per 
5-pound bag.

Stocking's Drug Store
(40-p)

RADIOS FOR SALE—Good Used 
Radios, battery and electric; 
also car radios. Will buy any 
kind of radio regardless of its 
condition.

Lee's Radio Repair Shop
Clarendon Hotel Phone 98-J

(50-p)

FOR SALE—House with four 
rooms, hall and bath, 12x24 gar­
age and 12x24 servants quarters. 
Nice grass and shrubbery. See 
Lee Muse. (48tfc)

FOR SALE— 1938 model W. C. 
Allis - Chalmers tractor with 
rubber tires and all equipment 
in good shape. See R. Gamble 
on J. M. Potter farm. (51-p)

TREATED GARDEN SEED—Buy 
treated garden seed in bulk. 
Treated seed kills all seed-borne 
diseases and increases the stand 
and yield. Treated garden seed 
in bulk, for sale at—

Stocking's Drug Storo
(50-p)

Call us for Window and Auto 
Glass. You always save at— 

Hudson k Taylors
(47tfc)

MOTH-PROOF your closets and 
house by using Apex Moth Kill­
ing Crystals or Larvex. Large 
supply at—

Stocking's Drug Storo
(48-p)

LTRY—Tone up your flock 
i increase egg production 
;h Dr. LeGears Poultry Pre- 
iption.
Stocking's Drug Storo

(50-p)
STOCKMEN and Dairymen—Pre­

vent or treat milk fever in cows 
with Calcium Gluconate. Vac­
cine syringes loaned for the 
purpose.

Stocking's Drug Storo
(48-p)

FOR SALE— Complete underseat 
Heater-Defroster, like new. Roy 
Clayton. (49tfc)

Wallpaper, Paints, glass, linoleum, 
Furniture. You always save at 

Hudson k Taylors
(47tfc)

FOR SALE—160 to 320 acre 
farms. Roy Clayton. (49tfc)

FOR SALE—1936 Dodge Pick-up. 
White-Way Laundry. (48tfc)

FOR SALE or LEASE—160 acre 
farm in Hall County, all in culti­
vation. Ben Wilson, Memphis, 
Texas. (50-c)

FOR SALE—6 room with bath 
room, private water works, two- 
car garage. Mrs. Sarah Skinner.

(50-p)

FOR SALE—One fresh milk cow 
with 2nd calf. Also white Leg­
horn pullets, laying. See E. V. 
Quattlebaum. (50-p)

W A N T E D
HELP WANTED—Lady or girl to 

do house work for family of 
three. Call 48-W. (48tfc)

PERMANENT WAVE, 59#! Do
your own Permanent with 
Charm - Kurl Kit. Complete 
equipment, including 40 curlers 
and shampoo. Easy to do, abso­
lutely harmless. Praised by 
thousands including June Lang, 
glamorous movie star. Money 
refunded if not satisfied.

Douglas k Goldston
(48-p)

FOR SALE—D-T Carbolated Cre- 
sote Base. Kills and Repels 
Mites, Fowl Ticks (Blue Bugs) 
and Repels Termites. Wood Pre­
server and Disinfectant 
Thomas Mill and Food Store 

(29-tfc)

AVENARIUS C A R  BOLINUEM 
guaranteed to kill blue bugs and 
mites; also preserves wood and 
prevents termites.

Stocking's Drug Stora
(35-p)

TO  OUR STO RK

M IR A C L E
W A LL  F IN IS H

Thompson Bros. Co.
Clarendon. Texas

We will buy your used Furniture. 
You always save at—

Hudson k Taylors
(47tfc)

WANTED— Empty feed sacks. 
Thomas Mill Sc Feed Store.

(31tfc)

Political
Announcements

Political announcements ap­
pearing in this column are sub­
ject to the action of the Demo­
cratic primary in July. All an­
nouncement fees must be paid in 
advance.

District Judge:
. LUTHER GRIBBLE

District Attorney:
SAM J. HAMILTON

Goldston, Jo Ann Hillman, Frank­
ie Homme), Dorothy Ann Ken­
nedy, Mary Nell Keys, Charline' 
Knox, Sara Beth Lowry, Leona 
Pearl McCraw, Frances Phelps, 
Annie Ree Porter, Helen Porter, 
La Rue Shadle, Margaret Faye 
Wadsworth, Peggy Rampy.

These girls wish to thank all 
those who donated food for this 
sale. This check will go toward 
our Soldier’s Kits fund, and we do 
appreciate the thought from the 
above members of this club.

County Judgo:
R. Y. KING

Sheriff. Assessor k Collector:
GUY WRIGHT

County k District Clerk:
HELEN WIEDMAN

County Treasurer:
MARGARET V. THOMPSON

County School Superintendent:
RUTH M. RICHERSON

Commissioner. Precinct 2:
J. R. BULLS

WANTED— Will pay cash for 
good used wire clothes hangers. 
Unlimited quantity needed. 
Parsons Bros. (9-tfc)

The Woman’s Exchange, 115 S. 
Gillispie, Pampa, Texas will sell 
your hand work, pillow cases, 
tea towels, aprons, luncheon 
sets, children’s pajamas, pina­
fores, baby garments and doll 
clothes. Try us. •/ (49-c)

WANTED—Scrap Iron. You can 
donate it if you like or I will 
buy it. Jerome Price. (50-c)

RADIO REPAIR WORK
Loo's Radio Ropair Shop

Clarendon Hotel Phone 98-J
(50-p)

WANTED—Will pay cash for two 
good young Jersey milk cows 
that are fresh or will be soon. 
Write Box 602, Clarendon or see 
Arthur Dowd. (51-p)

Donlny Countv Leader, S2 a year.

Commissioner, Precinct 1
H. S. MAHAFFEY

Commissioner Precinct 4:
MARVIN HALL

LELIA LAKE 
WHIRLWIND

IT'S UP TO YOU

OUK ENEMIES have boasted that 
American women are pampered, 

luxury-loving morons who would be 
of no help to our fighting men at war. 
But— they were wrong. American 
women everywhere are doing a bang- 
up job—in the service, in industry, in 
business, on the farm and in the home.

But—bigger incomes are 
tempting some women to 
buy luxuries they’vt wanted, 
perhaps for years, but which 
they don’t  really need now.

Every tru e  Am erican 
woman prays that the war 
will end—soon. But you’ve  
got to do more to hasten

this sHckar la yvw wladew i

A* H01KIH1 fXTM HON?.

4

WAR LOAN

victory, for 1944 is the year of decision. 
You’ve got to do your full duty by our 
hoys at the front by keeping up your 
regular purchases of War Bonds by 
buying at least one extra $100 Bond 
during this Drive and by saving every 
cent you can in the world’s best in­
vestment—War Bonds of the Fourth 

War Loan.
When the war is over, you’ll 

have a lot more money to buy 
what you want. Meanwhile, 
you can exult in the knowl­
edge that you are fighting for 
your country in the most 
effective way possible. Women 
of America—it’s up to youl

4th War laaa w ritles.

ti&Att BACK THE ATTACK 1 
FIRST NATIONAL BANK

MEMBER FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION

J R E D  C R O S S  ;
♦ VOLUNTEER SERVICE ♦
$ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

We are opening our column this 
week with a letter to Mr. and Mrs.
A. L. Chase from their son, Ar­
thur, which we thought would be 
of interest to everyone. It is from 
a war area with an APO No. 650, 
% Postmaster, New York, N. Y.

Dec. 24, 1943
Dear Folks:

I am writing from a very nice 
new Red Cross Club which very 
appropriately chose today as its 
opening date. The place is full of 
G.I.’s standing around the piano 
singing “Dreaming of a White 
Christmas" and Christmas Carols, 
which incidentally are the first I 
have heard since Christmas be­
fore last. Everyone has a very 
woebegone look about him, and 
it’s all a little sad, for at times 
like this you can’t help^but yearn 
(or the return of norn\al condi­
tions and the things yop, hava al­
w a y s  bald  dear. H ow eve r , w e  are 
all living in the hope that there 
will be no more Christmases like 
this one and the last two preced­
ing it. In the meantime, the Red 
Cross is doing an amazingly won­
derful job in places like this by 
giving us places to go in what 
spare time we have for entertain­
ment and relaxation.

There is a special midnight 
Catholic Mass tonight for soldiers 
at an Italian Church nearby, and 
since I have always wanrod to go 
to one, I think I’ll go to it.

Love,
Arthur.

Mrs. Allan Jefferies, our Ship­
ping Chairman, and Mrs. W. A. 
Riney, our Knitting Chairman, 
sent off a box of knitted garments 
to St. Louis this week. The knitted 
garments listed were made by the 
following. Two sweaters were 
made by Mrs. Frank Phelan, Mrs. 
Geo. Norwood, and Mrs. J. W. 
Evans; and one by each of the fol­
lowing: Mrs. Hattie Palmer, Mrs.
B. F. Kirtley, Mrs. Floyd Lump­
kin, Mrs. Cap Morris, Mrs. Frank 
Hutchins, Mrs. Eld Dishman, Mrs. 
Heckle Stark, Mrs. Gordon Stew­
art, Mrs. W. J. Lewis, Sr. of Dallas, 
Mrs. Frank Jones, Mrs. Wesley 
Knorpp, Mrs. Enrest Kent, Mrs. 
W. W. Noblet and Elizabeth Ann 
Beverly; two mufflers were knit­
ted by Mrs. Harold Bugbee, Mrs. 
Ollie Kendall, and Mrs. R. A. 
Chamberlain, and one by each of 
the following: Mrs. Colie Huff­
man, Mrs. J. R. Porter, Mrs. B. G. 
Watson, Mrs. Will Jonnson, Mrs. 
Dick Lanham, Mrs. D. W. Clam- 
pitt, Mrs. Bea Stone, Mrs. Tullis 
Davis, and Misses Margaret Faye 
Wadsworth, Ruth Donnell, Donna 
Lee Jones, Evelyn Jones, and 
June McMurtry. Four helmets 
were knitted by Mrs. Nova Mc­
Clure, two by Mrs. Frank Phelan, 
and one each by Mrs. C. W. Tay­
lor, Mrs. Jack Molesworth, Mrs. 
Bunk Ozier, and Miss Jessie Cook.

We want to thank Mrs. Nova 
McClure, Mrs. Frank Phelan, and 
Mrs. Ernest Kent for helping to 
finish knitted garments for ship­
ment.

The Junior Beaux Art Club 
sponsored by Miss Mary Howren 
and Mrs. J. R. Ross, turned in a 
check for $23.86 to the Red Cross, 
made from a food sale. Members 
of this club arc: Patricia Alyerson, 
Lavois Armstrong, Nelda Sue Bur­
ton, Betty Ann Craft, Glenda 
Davis, Jollne Etter, Betty John

WHO'S WHO
Name: Anna Sue McKee 
Age: 17
Ambition: Secretary 
Best all round girl: Catherine 

McElrath.
Best all round boy: Harold 

Usrey.
Best dressed girl: Frankie Wood 
Best dressed boy: Clyde Neil 
Best friends: Everybody 
Nickname: Susie Q 
Favorite orchestra: Tommy Dor­

sey.
Favorite song: “Sunday, Mon­

day, or Always.”
Favorite actress: Lana Turner 
Favorite actor: John Payne 
Pet Peeve: Gossip 
Likes: Civilians

PORK PROM FARM 
SLAUGHTERERS

Name: Martha Ann Clark 
Age: 16
Ambition: Graduate nurse 
Best all round girl: Earncstine 

White. •
Best all round boy: Harold Us­

rey.
Best dressed girl: Lois Reynolds 
Best dressed boy: Phalen Wea­

therly.
Best friends: “All the kids at 

Lelia High.”
Nickname: Clark 
Favorite orchestra: Harry James 
Favorite song: “Shoo - Shoo- 

Baby.”
Favorite actress: Greer Garson 
Favorite actor: Wulter Pidgeon 
Pet Peeve: Gossip 
Likes: Sailors

GOSSIP
It seems as if we had enough 

ways to go to Lakeview last Tues­
day night; Jimmy Lee Butler, H 
L. Lane, and Coach Naylor took 
their cars.

Another Senior boy, Edwin *“**'
•Mnis, left for the Army Monday *mount at 

We are glad to have Clyde Neil, 
who has started to school from 
Memphis, with us. He is a Senior.

Oh' Yes, we forgot Junior went 
to Lakeview with us too. But don’t 
worry Junior, Lois hadn’t forgot 
about you.

The Seniors got their jackets 
last Wednesday. They are all 
leather. The ones to receive a 
jacket were Martha Clark, Lois 
Reynolds, Beth Davis, Harold 
Usrey, J. E. Kidd, Edwin Mills 
and Coach Naylor.

Jack Jacqraain, and Billy Phil­
lips doubled dated Thursday nite.
Say! boys, who were the good 
looking gals?

Jimmie Lee Butler is taking 
Plane Geometry at Lelia.

Both boys and girls were defeat­
ed at the Lakeview games.

Dixie Lee Sisson started to 
school at Lelia again. She is a 
Junior.

Lois Marie saw a certain little 
blonde headed boy in Clarendon 
Sat. night. Wonder who it could 
have been?

Beth tore her new ball jacket; 
wonder if she found anyone to 
"curse” for her?

Wonder if Lois divided her 
chewing gum with Junior, Thurs­
day night? Junior seemed to think 
she had enough for both of them.

Sylvia Faye Morgan started to 
school at Lelia Monday morning.
We are glad to have her with us.

Kids remember this is Leap 
Year. Frankie went after Edwin 
Tuesday afternoon.

Wonder who added these last 
remarks. We’ll teach these Lelia 
kids to impose on two college 
girls!

Health Officer 
Warns Against 
Influenza

Commenting on the fact that 
there were approximately 25,000 
cases of flu reported in Texas last 
week, Dr. Geo. W. Cox, State 
Health Officer, said today that 
there is no way to estimate the 
number of additional cases not at­
tended b ya physician, therefore 
not reported.

Dr. Cox urged every Texan to 
do his utmost to protect himself 
and his family from the dangers 
of influenza and its possible com­
plications and stressed the fact 
that it is not a disease to be re­
garded lightly.

“It is a seriosu mistake to try to 
fight flu, on your feet. Complete 
bed rest, lots of liquids, a light 
diet, and treatment prescribed by 
a competent physician are the 
steps most necessary to early re­
covery,” Dr. Cox said.

“Pneumonia is a frequent com­
plication of influenza, and with 
vitality low from the effects of 
flu, pneumonia can be an unusual­
ly serious menace,” Dr. Cox said.

The State Health Officer said 
that avoiding undue exposure to 
cold, wet weather, maintaining 
good ventilation, obtaining suffic* 
ient sleep and eating a nourishing 
well-balanced diet will aid in 
building up physical resistance 
and may help to ward off influ­
enza. If, in spite of these precau­
tions, fever, boncachc, and other 
flu symptoihs appear, the patient 
should go to bed immediately and 
consult his family physician.

Wanted To Take 
Husband’s Place

Frances Sypert Ford, Hallsville,
Texas, is in “boot training” at 
Camp Lejeune learning to be a 
Woman Marine because she 
“wanted to take my husband’s 
place in this war.”

He was Lieut, (jg) William 
Richard Ford, and he lost his life 
when the USS Cushing went 
down in a battle in the Southwest 
Pacific.

Mrs. Ford, a graduate of South­
ern Methodist University, taught 
school at Hallsville and Carlisle 
before she enlisted in the Marines.

Development of aviation is cre­
ating a "new geography”, based on 
the circle map, not the old flat 
map, declares Dr. John H. Fred­
erick, University of Texas trans­
portation professor. Because 4/5 
of the population of the earth liv­
es in the northern hemisphere, the 
shortest international air route is 
over the North Pole, he explains.

Mrs. Melvin Enzy of San Angelo 
is visiting her aunt and uncle, Mr. 
and Mrs. G. W. Kemp.

Haskell Kemp and Hawley Har­
rison made a business trip to Dal­
las over the week end.

A son was born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Will P. Chamberlain in the Clar­
endon Clinic about 3 p. m. Tues­
day. Mother and babe doing nice­
ly at last report.

Mrs. J. A. Warren returned to 
her home here Friday after a four 
weeks stay in Amarillo with sick 
relatives.

Twelve red stamps in book four, 
which are numbered "8” and let­
tered from ‘‘A’’ through "M”, may 
be used for buying pork and other 
rationed meats from farm slaugh­
terers. These stamps will not be 
used by consumers in general un­
til February 27. They will have 
same expiration dates for pur 
chases from farmers as in city 
markets. The stamps are worth 10 
points each, making a total value 
of 120 points. This does not give 
the individual who buys from a 
farm slaughterer a larger meat 
ration than anyone else. It merely 
allows him to buy a fairly large 

one time. In addition, 
brown stamps in book three may 
be used ahead of their regular 
validity dates when used in buy­
ing from farmers.

Bob Williams has bought out 
the farming interests of M. L. 
Putman, and has moved to that 
farm south of town.

Mr. and Mrs. Karl Adams visit­
ed her sister, Mr. and Mrs. R. F. 
McConnell at Pampa Sunday.

Mable Mongole of Alanreed was 
home over the week end.

tm  aoMisr county lu in .  st.at ru  m i

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Mongole and 
Miss Edgar Mae visited her nep­
hew, Ralph Zackery at Pantex.

Mrs. Millard Word and Mrs. 
Pete Kunz attended the musical 
program at Amarillo Wed. night.

W. A. Poovey and Ed Wheeler 
were down from Ashtola'Monday 
attending business matters.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Goldston at­
tended an Optometrists’ meeting 
in Amarillo Sunday and Monday.

Baby Chicks
First Hatch—Feb. 1$

Will have Chicks every Tues­
day and Friday thereafter.

CLARENDON
HATCHERY

CLARENDON, TEXAS

I. ■!" ■■■■.; Mu

Miss Clyde Shepherd was ab­
sent Monday and Tuesday this 
week from the J. A. Warren In­
come Tax Office, on account of 
she and her family moving from 
Lakeview to Memphis where they 
will now make their home.

Mr. and Mrs J. W. McDonald 
were over from Quitaque over the 
week end, visiting their daughter, 
Mrs. Adell Williams and family.

Mayburn Trout and family were 
in Saturday from the Van Eaton 
Ranch. . ,

The Prep
SHAVE

DeLuxe

«M* to Vlrut Mattoaal

CLEAN. COOL SHAVES
YES, wa taka pride la pleasing 
Ton. Once you try our Prep Shave 
and feel the difference, you will 
always come back for the next 
shave. We will appreciate a visit 
from you. Let us prove Itl

McGOWAN’S
Barber Shop

Mr. and Mrs. J. A  Warren Jr. 
and Barbara of Borger, spent Sun­
day night here with their parents.

Hi
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Broncho Range-
(Continued (rum Page 7) 

Lloyd Maya, Ash tola; Rex Brad' 
ford, Borger; Jo Ellen McGowan, 
Lalla Lake.

Miaa McGowan’* room haa a 
new pupil, Bertha Mae Reid, from 
Chamberlain.

Glenn Wallace, Mary Eather 
Hagler and Inelle Cox, apeech pu­
pil* of Mr*. Mean, read at the 
Lion* luncheon Tuesday.,

JR. HIGH
Buster Bain's uncle who is sta­

tioned at Uvalde ha* been visiting 
him.

Le Moin Patrick visited hi* cou­
sin in Memphis.

Our section ha* the chapel pro­
gram Friday. Wo have plenty of 
talent and are making use of it.

Glenn Reed from Chamberlain 
has enrolled. We are glad to have 
him.

We are going to be 100 per cent 
in buying stamps.

Harley Bradford of Borger has 
enrolled in the seventh grade.

DR. H. R. BECK
D t N T l S T

Phtmm «

#»<•' ? -Office hours—1 to ft

(IflhHtm- Bldg

BAND NEWS
The band is a very busy organi­

zation these days. The War Bond 
committee has asked the band to 
help them with their War Bund 
drives, and the members very 
willingly accepted. The band will 
play for most of the rallies in the 
different communities. Next Tues­
day the band will play for the 
rally here in town, and they are 
wry busy working up number*.

Mr Robbins ha* asked the band 
to attend a Band Clinic sponsored 
by the Pampa High School Band 
at Pampa this Friday. Feb 4 The 
members are looking forward to 
this trip with a great deal of inter­
est, and hope that nothing pre­
vents them from attending

Mrs. Ray Wilson and small 
daughter June of Paducah are 
visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Cap Lane.

♦ LELIA LAKE •

Mrs Aneel Barton and daugh­
ter. Linda of Houston, arrived a 
feu dsn1* age to apend several 
days with relative* at Antelope 
Plat and other parts of the coun­
try.

Mr and Mrs Prank Bourland 
anti daughter. Mrs. -Jeannt Ross 
wear tr Amariflr Tuesday

Mr. and Mrs. Malone of Friona 
and Obie Malone of the Navy Sea- 
bees visited with Mr. and Mrs. C. 
G. Knox and other friends Thurs.

Mrs. Charlie Young and daugh­
ters Veda Rae and Mr*. Ozolle 
Brock went to Memphis Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Wolford and 
Monty Ray went to Amarillo Sat

Mr. and Mr*. Edd Morton moved 
to the Heckle Stark farm Friday.

Mr and Mrs. H R. King and Mr. 
and Mrs J R Batson had businesa 
in Amarillo Saturday

Mrs Marjorie Jaoqmatn and 
Jack moved into our community 
Saturday Mrs. Jacqmain tcache* 
Home Ec in the school.

Odell Holland had busiiKW in 
Panhandle Saturday

Mr and Mr* T R Roberts of 
Memphis spent Sunday in the 
home of Mr and Mrs. D. R Leath­
ers

Mr and Mr* F A Floyd and 
Eddie speed Sunday with his par­
ents. Mr and Mrs Bill Floyd of 
Wed ley

Mr and Mr* White and family 
of Om iI tpm t Sunday with Ms

McMURRY COLLEGE
B NOW B K M B  ■ A GKAT CAMPAIGN F0« $1,750,000.00 

FQK NUBM6 EXPANSION AND EMOWMMT
4  NEW BUILDINGS $750,000 .00

brother J. E. White and family.
Mrs. Lanelie LoveUuly of Ama­

rillo sepnt the weekend with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. L. Lewis.

Mr. and Mrs. A. O. Hill were 
called to Memphis Saturday night 
by the illness of Mrs. Hill’s moth­
er.

GOLDSTON
Wilma Smith

Mr. and Mrs. King of Ashtola 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Lester 
Shields Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Neely Hudson and 
Dwayne and Joe Wayne Dllli vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stewart 
and Gilbert Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Roberson and 
children visited Mr. and Mrs. Les­
ter Shields Sunday.

Sgt. and Mrs Eulun Higdon and 
Mrs. Willard Higdon and babies 
and Rev. and Mrs. Buren Higdon 
and baby visited in the W. C. Hig­
don home last week.

Mrs Collier Brock and family 
visited in Borger over the week­
end.

Donna Jean and Betty Guin 
spent Sunday night with Marjorie 
and Mable Dean Brook

Thvue to visit in the Edd Moor­
ing home Sunday were Mr. and 
Mr* Buck Parker and W. R . Mr 
and Mrs J. R Porter and Mr. and 
Mrs Walter Goldston

Naoma Mooring and Jimmie 
Nell Parker spentt Sunday with 

j Lucille Dale.
Bernier and Annese Rattan 

i spent Friday night with Carolyn 
McBnsyer.

Ina Brock visited in Memphis 
over the week end.

Carolyn McBrayer spent the 
week end with Bernice and An- 
ncce Rattan.

Mr. and Mrs. Allan Phillips and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. W. M. 
McBrayer and Ethlyn Rattan 
spent Sunday in the Odell Me 
Brayer home.

First Class Gunners Mate Leon­
ti is Yankee and wife visited in the 
Wilson Gray home last week.

Beatrice Smith is reported as 
feeling better at this writing. We 
wish her a speedy recovery.

Arvis Guin spent Sunday night 
with Lavon McBrayer.

M I D W A Y
Mrs. Job a Goldston

W. T. L I N K
L A W Y E R

INCOME TAX SERVICE

♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦
Herman (Doc) Higgins left Mon­

day for Lubbock for induction in­
to the Army.

Mrs. Henry Riley visited in the 
W. K. Davis and Allen homes Sat. 
and Sunday.

Mrs. Allen and son Riley of 
Sunnyvicw visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. W. K. Davis Sunday.

Mrs. J. T. Stone visited with 
Mrs. Jenny Stone Saturday after­
noon.

Sue Stone visited this past week 
with her sister, Mrs. Pete Riley. 
Mrs. Riley and Sue both being 
dinner guests of their mother, 
Mrs. Stone, Sunday.

Mrs. Edith Longan was a guest 
in the Frank Hardin home Sun­
day.

Ida Mae Wiedman spent the 
week end with Betty John Gold­
ston.

Mr. and Mrs. Tankersley and 
family are moving to Clarendon, 
having bought a home on the 
highway in Clarendoa They are 
putting on a new roof and re­

papering their new home this 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. Koontz have a new 
baby in their home. It is one week 
old.

The Fourth War Loan drive is 
coming right along in Midway. 
Remember every bond bought 
helps bring our boys home.

The following article was taken 
from the magazine “Grit.”

An Induct** Sp*aks
I have been inducted into the 

army. No, I do not want to go to 
war. I am a young man just get­
ting a start in life. I have a lovely 
wife and a wonderful baby. I don’t 
want to go to war because I like 
to come home at night, put on soft 
shoes, light up my pipe, and sit 
peacefully by the fireside with my 
family.

I don’t want to go to war be­

cause I’m living a good life, in a 
good American home. I like to 
have my evenings free to read the 
newspaper and listen to the radio. 
I like to have time to taek a drink, 
if I like, and blow smoke rings. 
I’d rather get up at the sound of 
an alarm clock than a bugle.

I don’t want to go to war be­
cause I like to stand on the corner 
and argue with my neighbors 
about whatever my fancy desires. 
I like to be able to go to church 
on Sunday or sleep late.

No, I don’t want to go to war. 
But neither do 10,000,000 other 
men. And the reasons why I do 
not want to go to war are the very 
reasons why it is necessary that I 
go. This home, this wife, this 
baby—this quiet, peaceful life of 
freedom—must be saved!

—Pvt Ransom Gurganus.

Be Quick To Treat 
Bronchitis

Chronic bronchitis may develop If 
your cough, chest cold, or acute bron­
chitis U not treated and you cannot 
off ord to take a chance with any medi­
cine less potent than Creomulslon 
which goes right to the seat of the 
trouble to help loosen and expel germ 
laden phlegm and aid nature to 
soothe and heal raw, tender. Inflamed 
bronchial mucous membranes.

Creomulslon blends beechwood 
creosote by special process with other 
time tested medicines for coughs. 
It contains no narcotics.

No matter how many medicine# 
you have tried, tell your druggist to 
sell you a bottle of Creomulslon with 
the understanding you must like the 
war it quickly allays the cough, per­
mitting rest and sleep, or you are to

INSURANCE
FIRE •  TORNADO •  HAIL •  AUTO

AND ALL KINDRED LINES

BONDS O NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
Pboae 11 i-i C. C. Powell

PAINT
WALLPAPER

FURNITURE
GLASS

Painting 4 Paper Hanging
YOU ALWAYS SAVE AT

HUDSON & TAYLOR’S
Opposite Poet Office Phone B3-M

Wh  i Dofimtof y Girl’s PenaNery Fine Arts Building

$1,000,000.00 P E R M A N E N T  ENDOW MENT
You Will Wont To Hare o Port in the

Greater McMurry College Program
BUT

You Must Buy Bonds— 4th War Loan Bonds
Yn  WIN Do BoHi When You Buy •  Bond

(Series " F "  or " G " )  IN THE N A M E OF M cM U RRY COLLEGE, 
A  Corporation, Abilene, Toxos

Buy o Bond-Bock tho A ttack-H elp W in tho W ar-M oke o 

Worthy Contribution to

C H R I S T I A N  E D U C A T I O N
$25.00, $50.00, $100.00, $500.00, $1,000.00

Hslp Lay H i, Foundations tor an Enduring F a a c . by Building a 

Callage T h at W ill Produce Christian Leadership for tha Future

WHEN YOU GUY A BOND IN THE NAM E OF McMURRY COURSE 
YOU DO FIVE THINGS:
1. You discharge your responsibility to your Country in responding to the 4th War 

Loan Drive.
2. You help your County reach its quoto of Bond Soles.
3. You help Build and Strengthen o Christion College to .Preserve What Our Men 

Are Fighting For.
4. You con deduct your Contribution from your 1944 Income Tax Report up to 

15%.
5. You con honor the name of some one 1 n the service In your gift to McMurry 

College.

Mail the Bond to O. P. Throne, Business Mgr., 
McMurry College, Abilene, Texas

4th WAR LOAN
B illion to Be 

in  Series "E ” Bonds

THEY'RE FIGHTING  . . .
ARE YOU BUYING>

The kid who lived next door . . .  
the girl up the s tre e t. . .  Sister 
Sue’s oldest b oy ... your so n ... 
they are doing the fighting in this 
war. And are doing it well. But 
YOU — you’re the guy that has to 
do the buying.

YOU are the onlf one who can 
decide how much EXTRA you should 
put into War Bonds as your part of 
the Fourth War Loan Drive. Re­

member, as you figure it out, that—
Time to a soldier is a commodity 

of life and death. He cannot sell It 
or buy it. He cannot cash it in at the 
nearest bank. He has to endure it. 
Each day longer that a soldier must 
fight lessens his chance of survival. 
Your purchase of EXTRA War 
Bonds should shorten his fighting 
time.

Modern warfare is often a ques­

tion of logistics. Victory—men be­
ing equal—goes to the side which is 
best supplied and equipped. Your 
purchases of EXTRA War Bonda 
will give you more rights to insist 
that it be properly spent to equip 
those fighting for you.

Yes, aa you figure it out remem­
ber. . .  They’re doing the fighting 
— it’s up to YOU to do the buyii^, 

le*1# ALL BACK THI ATTACK!

Wfest Texas U tilities 
Company
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COLONIAL LIFE AND 
LITERATURE
By Bob Bentley

(Pupil of Mrs. Cox)
Colonial America had a scarcity 

of literature because it was so 
tremendously occupied otherwise. 
When the settlers first arrived in 
America, they had to set to work 
and build houses, clear land, plant 
crops, and erect forts to fight hos­
tile Indians. At the end of a day 
like this, they were not inclined to 
write, but to rest. Thus the litera­
ture that developed out of this 
turmoil was purely of a simple 
nature such as diaries and jour­
nals about every day happenings.

The first people to establish a 
colony in America were the Cava­
liers, led by Captain John Smith, 
who landed at Jamestown, Vir­
ginia in the year 1607. These were 
the people that upheld the state 
church in England during the 
revolution over there. They lived 
the leisurely life of gentlemen, do­
ing only the things that were 
necessary. Their main interest 
was politics, so they did very lit­
tle writing.

The Pilgrims arrived at Ply­
mouth, Massachusettts in the year

1620. They were led by Captain 
Miles Standish who was later im­
mortalized by Longfellow. Among 
these pilgrims was William Brad­
ford who wrote the first American 
literature regarding history. The 
Puritans were very different from 
the Cavaliers. They were the peo­
ple who had tried to purify Eng­
lish religion in the revolution but 
had failed. Thus, they moved to 
America seeking free religion. 
Being very religious, they also be­
lieved in education, and it was not 
long before they had set up 
schools. By the year 1636 they had 
established Harvard University.

The Puritan ministers in that 
day ruled the people by repeating 
the will of the Lord to the people. 
Among other things, the people 
expected the minister to write 
literature also. Among these Puri­
tan ministers came the Mathers, 
three brothers who gave their life 
to the ministry and writing litera­
ture. They wrote many things but 
their literature is not read any 
more. Probably the greatest Puri­
tan minister was Jonathan Ed­
wards. He was a wonderful orator. 
He had a forceful voice if need be, 
and also a very kind voice. He 
wrote some literature. The most

Just Arrived—Car of bast Colorado LUMP COAL.

THE BEST YET!
You can still get the best when you buy Chlc-O- 
Line Egg mash. It still contains yellow corn for 
grain and Is 20% Protein. Bring us your grinding 
and mixing, we can do it like you want it. We 
have all kinds of grains and other feeds.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
PHONE 14 9

famous is “On the Freedom of the 
Will”, but he usually spent most of 
his time on sermons he was pre­
paring.

Among the first literature were 
the diaries of Samuel Sewall and 
William byrd. Sewell's diary gives 
a clear picture of the every day 
life in the New England colonies. 
Byrd's diary gives a view of the 
life of a southern gentlemen. Will­
iam Strachey’s shipwreck was 
more than likely the first journal 
in America.

The histories were written by 
Captain John Smith, who wrote 
on the history of the Jamestown 
settlement in his “True Relation," 
and William Bradford who wrote 
an account of the landing of the 
Pilgrims. Another man, John 
Winthrop, wrote the history of the 
Massachusetts Bay Colony. Haw­
thorne got much information from 
Winthrop when he wrote “The 
Scarlet Letter.”

The poetry among the colonial 
Americans was very limited. The 
Cavaliers had no use for poetry at 
all. The Puritans had a great use 
for literature, and this was illus­
trated by "The Bay Psalm Book.” 
This book was a collections of the 
Psalms from the Bible put into 
metrical form for singing. Another 
poem book was the “New England 
Primer." This was for teaching 
school children the Pilgrim relig­
ion. "The Day of Doom” by Mich- 
eal Wigglesworth, was very fam­
ous in the seventeenth century. It 
tells us how vividly real both 
Heaven and Hell seemed to the 
Puritans.

the other on plans for the future, 
“Now that I’m a First Grader,” 
that were enjoyed by everyone.

“Cute as Cotton,” a piano solo, 
was played by Sybil Head.

The next number was two very 
fetching readings by Mary Esther 
Hagler, a little girl who will be a 
real "orator” in the future.

This was followed by two vocal 
numbers given by Arvazene 
Smith, soprano, and Rubye Jo 
Kidd, alto; accompanied by Ochi- 
nita Heath.

Another speaker who is already 
well trained, Mary Ladell Cox, 
gave two witty readings; one on 
school, its virtues and faults; the 
other on marriage, its virtues and 
faults.

This was followed by a string 
trio, who have favored us before, 
Peggy Stewart, Violin; Claude 
Hearne, guitar; and Mr. Drennan, 
piano.

These interesting numbers can 
be attributed to the pupils of Mrs. 
Bryan and to the speech class of 
Mrs. Mears. We shall be looking 
forward to their favoring us again 
in the future.

CHAPEL
The chapel program last Friday 

was very unusual; yet very inter­
esting and entertaining, in that we 
were exposed to some new talent 
(to us anyway). Most of this pro­
gram was given by the younger 
set.

Scharlene Pyeatt delighted us 
with a lovely piano solo, “Cotton 
Fluff.”

Glen Wallace then gave two 
clever readings; one on fishing,

CORRIDOR COMMENTS
Calvin Merchant was really up 

in the air about something that he 
thought Johnnie did last Sunday. 
We wonder—Could it be flirting 
with other boys??

Edith didn’t seem to be very 
happy about something Friday. 
What was wrong, Edith?

Lotella Long, a former C.H.S. 
student, was seen on the Campus 
Thursday afternoon.

We are happy to have two new 
pupils in school, Dorothy Church­
man from Sudan, and Edith Jo 
Becket from Memphis. Both are 
Juniors.

Barbara Bell seemed to be en­
joying herself in the first period 
study hall Monday—looking at 
pictures in her biology book.

PERSONALITY
Name: Rubye Jo-Kidd

Nickname: Skeet
Grade: Freshman
Pet Peeve: Teasing everyone 

that comes along.
Pals: Everyone
Best All round girl: Ochinita 

Heath.
Best all around boy: Douglas 

Lowe.
Best dressed girl: Louise Under­

down.
Best dressed boy: Sam Lowry
Best girl dancer: Mary Ann 

Bromley.
Best boy dancer: Billy Chilton
Favorite actor: James Craig
Favorite actress: Paulette God­

dard.
Favorite orchestra: Tommy Dor­

sey.
Favorite pastime: Playing foot­

ball and riding horseback.

A BLUEJACKET 
By Ruth Roberts

My brother is a bluejacket,
He sails the ocean blue,
He goes from one port to another, 
I bet he gets homesick, too.
We all miss my brother 
But he fights for the country he 

loves,
And he will return home safely 
For we believe in God up above.
If, in your family, there is a blue­

jacket,
I guess you know how I feel 
We hope that they’ll return home 

safely
And I kinda think they will.

SOUTH WARD
Miss Mongole’s pupils are learn­

ing to write letters and address 
envelopes.

Mrs. Prewitt’s pupils are taking

up a study of birds and their mi­
grations.

Mrs. Headrick's pupils have fin­
ished their Eskimo pictures and 
are drawing houses.

Miss Stevens has a new pupil. 
He is Jimmie Phillips of Odessa.

Ir Mrs. Bain's room Dewey Fos­
ter is the first pupil to have a 
father in the service. New pupils 
are: Josephine Spear, Ashtola;

(Continued to Page 6)

Wanted! Men and 
Women Who Are 

Hard off Hearing
To m ake th ii  sim ple, no  risk  hearing  te s t. 
I f  yon are  tem porarily  deafened, bothered  
by ringing b ussing  head noises due to  hard ­
ened or coagulated  w ax (cerum en), t r y  th e  
O urine Home M ethod te s t  th a t  so m any say  
has enabled them  to  h ea r  well again. You 
m u st bear b e tte r  a f te r  m aking th is  sim ple 
te a t o r you g e t  y our m oney M e t  a t  ones. 
Ask about Ourine E a r D rops today a t

Douglas ft Goldston Drug Co.

DANCE
Mary Ellen Pipes gave a dance 

at the Opera House last Thursday 
evening. About twenty couples en­
joyed the good music, splendid 
floor, and delightful refreshments. 
Mrs. Q o o d n e r , Mr. a n d  M rs . Pipes 
and Mr. Drennatf were the chaper 
ones for the evening.

SCHOOL DANCE
The Sophomore class of C.H.S. 

gave a “Neutral” dance last Fri­
day night. The boys “cut in” on 
the girls, and the girls returned 
the compliment by “cutting in” on 
them. The chaeprones were Mrs. 
Stricklin, Miss Howren, Mrs. Cox, 
Mr. and Mrs. Burton, and Mr. 
Drennan.

Farm-Home Supplies
BABY CHICKS - FIELD SEEDS

Book Yours Now
PURINA “CHEK-R-CHIX”

AH popular breeds......... $13.50 per hundred
BLOOD-TESTED— BRED TO LIVE— GROW & LAY

—ALSO—
M. JOHNSON - WHITE LEGHORNS 

. BOOK YOUR CHICKS & FIELD SEEDS NOW

CLOTHING
MEN - BOYS - KIDDIES 
Jimmy-alls It Bib Pants 

ilia 3 to 8
Boys and Kiddias Shirts 

sisa 2 to 13
BOYS KHAKI PANTS 

6 to 16
KHAKI PANTS Sc SHIRTS
M an............................ 82.49

Shorts 8c Shirts for man 
SHOES - FOR MEN 
Glovaa. Socks. Tlaa 

Undarwear
Blankat Lined Jackata 

Man and Boys

Quality Feeds
PURINA  CHOWS

and

SUNNY BOY FEEDS

Egg Mash ..............  S3.S9
16% Dairy Faad 83.2S
Chick Startar $3.98
Bran. Shorts. Ground Whaat 

"A Faad for Every 
Poultry Ic Livestock Need"

HARDWARE
& Notions
Garden Hose - 50 ft. 

Cream Cans. Milk Buckets, 
Flashlight Batteries. Enamel 
Ware. Poultry Supplias, 
Feeders. Water Founts, a 
few Brooders.

Always shop this Dept.

Lister Share Points for all makes
REPAIR PARTS FOR OLIVER TRACTORS JUST RECEIVED

Make This Store Your Headquarters for

FARM & HOME SUPPLIES’Ml i f f

NOBLITT SALES CO.
Phone 77 Phone 77

Donley County Leader. 82 a year.

Have a Coca-Cola = Skal
(HERE’S TO YOU)

. . . o r  a way to be warm -hearted in  Iceland
Shat, says the Icelander when he wants to with you well. Havt *  “Coke", says 
the Yank in the same spirit. In every clime Haw a “ Coke”  is a phrase that breaks 
the ice between strangers. That’s why Coca-Cola always belongs in your icebox 
at home. Yes, from the equator to the poles, Coca-Cola stands for the fmuu that 
refreshes,— has become the global symbol of those who wish well to their 
fellow men.

• IO T T IID  UNOIS AUTHORITY OR TN I COCA-COIA COMPANY BV

MEMPHIS C O C A - C O L A  BOTTLING COMPANY

It's natural for popular name* 
to acquire friendly abbrevia­
tion*. That’* why you hear 
Coca-Cola called “Coke”.

.O l’UTWC-CCa..
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Farmer AAA 
Organization 
Praised

N. E. Dodd, chief of the Agricul­
tural Adjustment Agency, trans­
mitting the agency’s report to 
Marvin Jones, War Food Admin­
istrator, today praised the farmer- 
elected committeeman organiza­
tion of AAA as “the spearhead for 
agriculture’s remarkable wartime 
accomplishments."

Dodd said that the committee­
man organization provides "the 
framework that enables 6 million 
individual farmers in thousands of 
farm communities to work togeth­
er as a team” to solve many of 
agriculture's problems both in 
peace and war.

“Without question, the post­
war period will bring problems 
and a need for world-shaking ad­
justments of a different kind,” the 
Chief said. “Whatever comes, 
farmers know that when individ­
ual action is not enough, the furm- 
er committees have proved them­
selves an effective framework for 
joint action."

The report reviews the accom­
plishments of Stute, county and 
community committi-emcn during 
the 11 years of AAA programs. In 
peace-time, the committeeman or­
ganization helped farmers solve 
the problem of unmarketable sur 
pluses through production adjust­
ments and marketing quotas the 
report states. When war came, 
Triple-A devoted itself to mobiliz­
ing American farmers into “one 
huge, efficient production ma­
chine." The expanded and differ­
ent needs of wartime were deter­
mined. und then national produc­
tion goals were translated into 
terms which informed each indi­
vidual farmer how he could make 
his maximum contribution to vic­
tory.

Running through both the pre­
war and war periods, Triple-A’s 
soil conservation program has 
helped to maintain and increase 
soil productivity by encouraging 
farmers to adopt soil-building 
practices, the report stated. Since 
the AAA conservation program 
became fully effective in 1937,

average crop yields for the 1937- 
42 period increased nearly 21 per­
cent above the 1923-32 average. 
More than 84 percent of all the 
cropland in the U. S. was covered 
by the 1942 Agricultural Conser­
vation Program.

Pointing out that the 100,000 
farmer committeemen carry full 
responsibility for field adminis­
tration of the conservation pro­
gram, the report lists several other 
pre-war committeemen functions 
which have continued into the 
war years. These jobs include ad­
ministration in the field of such 
programs as commodity loans, 
crop purchases, cover-crop seed 
production and crop insurance.

State and county AAA chair­
man also serve ■ as chairman of 
USDA War Boards which have 
administered such programs as 
farm machinery and supplies, ra­
tioning, the issuance of construc­
tion permits and farmer applica­
tions for gasoline and tires. Re­
sponsibility for the functions de­
tailed in the foregoing has recent­
ly been delegated directly to the 
Triple-A committee.

Commenting on plans for 1944, 
the report said that the farmer 
committee men soon will began 
the 1944 production goals drive, 
telling their neighbors of national 
needs and helping them plan their 
individual operations in line with 
requirements for food, fiber and 
crop oils.

Expenditures of Triple-A for 
the fiscal year ending June 30, 
1943 totaled $638,709,513, includ­
ing $373,212,215 for agricultural 
conservation payments and $197,- 
481,980 for parity payments.

THE SKY’S THE LIM IT—Starring Joan Leslie and Fred Astaire 
which comes to the Pastime Theatre, Saturday Night Prevue, 
Sunday and Monday, February 5, 6, 7th.

Billy Ralph Andis, who is in the 
Army Specialized Training Pro­
gram, in the University at Syra­
cuse, New York, is home on a fur­
lough visiting with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Andis. He will 
be here for a week.

Karl Adams has sold his town 
residence to County Agent Chas. 
Reed, and Mr. and Mrs. Adams 
moved to their country home near 
Chamberlain Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Cap Morris and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. Horace 
Green spent the week end in 
Foard County.

QUALITY BUYING IS

W ARTIM E T H R I F T
Yes, it is thrifty these days to buy the best of Quality foods 
- - - for in serving the best, you are doing your family the 
most good in building up their health. We have a complete 
assortment of Quality foods at all times along with the best 
fruits and vegetables the market affords.

IN OUR MARKET—You find quality in the highest type 
when you shop for our choice cuts of extra fancy, grain fed 
baby beef. Hot barbecue every day

CLIFFORD & RAY
GROCERIES & MEATS

COLD STORAGE LOCKER PLANT IN CONNECTION
5 Phone 6 

WE DELIVER

CIVIL SERVICE 
ANNOUNCEMENT

Persons with a knowledge of 
business and industry will have 
an opportunity to serve their gov­
ernment in the OPA, WPB, Small­
er War Plants Corporation, WMC 
and other federal agencies in the 
state of Texas, at salaries ranging 
from $2600 to $6500 a year, plus 
overtime, Elmer G. Hayes, local 
civil service secretary said today 
posting a new type of civil sendee 
exaimnation announcement for 
top ranking administrative posi­
tions.

The general type of positions to 
be filled include: statistician, 
board operations officer, price 
specialist, tire inspector, investi­
gator, economist, price analyist, 
accountant, chief of office servic­
es, priority and order specialist, 
industrial analyst, redistribution 
analyst, compliance examiner, in­
dustrial specialist, contract spec­
ialist, training specialist, manpow­
er utilization consultant, place­
ment specialist, labor market ana­
lyst, administrative assistant, 
training within industry repre­
sentative, training within indus­
try specialist and other similar 
positions.

Applications should be filed im­
mediately with the director, 10th 
civil service region, 210 S. Har­
wood St., Dallas, 1, Texas.

WORLD DAY OF PRAYER
All women organizations of all 

the different churches will meet 
at the Presbyterian Church Febru­
ary 25th at 3 p. m. for the World 
Day of Prayer.

Joyce Smith returned home 
Monday from a visit with her 
brother, Joe Tom Smith and other 
relatives in Panhandle. Joe Tom 
left for San Francisco, Calif. Wed. 
where he is in service.

12 Red Stamps In 
Ration Book IV 
Explained

Some misunderstanding has 
come about relative to the valida­
tion of the twelve red stamps in 
War Ration Book IV, for use in 
buying pork and other rationed 
meat from farmers.

“This is a loan, not a bonus, 
thus permitting purchase now and 
storage for use later." The ad­
vance use of stamps, it was ex­
plained, does not give the individ­
ual who buys from a farm slaugh­
terer a larger meat ration than 
anyone else. It merely allows the 
individual, buying from a farmer, 
to follow the normal practice of 
buying fairly large amounts at one 
time.

At the same time, it encourages 
farmers to slaughter on their 
farm, thus cutting down the num­
ber of hogs coming into the con­
gested markets.

The red stamps in Book IV 
which may now be used for buy­
ing meat from farm slaughterers 
are those numbered “8” and let­
tered from “A" through “M”. 
These stamps are worth 10 points 
each, making a total of 120 points.

The families purchasing farm- 
slaughtered meat will need to use 
care that they do not run short on 
red points later and that they have 
enough valid red stamps for buy­
ing butter, cheese, and other fats 
when the red stamps become valid 
for use in retail stores.

Mrs. Collinson and Virginia 
Fritchie of Mrianllo spent the 
week end in* th P ^ t. M. Morris
home.

Would Extend Social 
Insurance To Twenty 
Million More Persons

Early action to bring the bene­
fits of social insurance to some
10.000. 000 self-employed Ameri­
cans—including farm operators 
and business and professional men 
and women—is urged in the Eight 
Annual Report of the Social Se­
curity Board, just issued for the 
fiscal year 1943.

The report points out that some
5.000. 000 farmers and about the 
same number of “other self-em­
ployed” are now excluded from 
the old-age and survivors’ insur­
ance system. These groups form 
about half of the 20,000,000 Ameri­
can workers whom the board 
would bring under the Federal in­
surance system to make its bene­
fits available to all who work for 
a living. The other 10,000,000 now 
excluded are some 4,000,000 farm 
workers, 2,000,000 household work 
ers, and the employees of govern­
mental and nonprofit organiza­
tions.

The unemployment insurance 
program would also bek extended 
to give its protection to all wage 
and salary earners, if the board’s 
proposals are adopted. Maritime 
workers and many employees of 
small firms, as well as most of 
those now exoluded from old-age 
and survivors’ insurance, are de­
nied coverage under the present 
State unemployment insurance 
laws.

The board also recommends that 
insurance be provided against the 
costs of hospital and medical care, 
and against lack of income due to 
sickness and disability. While 
great progress has been made in 
extending the average length

of life and raising standards of 
physical well-being, the report 
says, “there are groups whose 
chances of survival are no greater 
than those which existed in the 
United States 60 years ago. Some 
places, especially rural areas, are 
almost without access to modern 
facilities to prevent and cure sick­
ness.”

Insurance against the costs of 
hospital and medical care, the 
board insists, must “preserve free 
choice of doctor or hospital and 
personal relationship between 
phvsicians and their patients, to 
Maintain professional leadership, 

to insure adequate remuneration.”

BROTHERHOOD MEETING
On Wed., Feb. 9th at 3 p. m. all 

the women organizations of all the 
different churches will meet at the 
Presbyterian Church for a Broth­
erhood meeting.

Mrs. Bill Bromley and daughter 
Mary Ann, visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. M. W. Mosley at Hedley 
over the week end. Mr. and Mrs. 
Mosley left this Thursday for 
East Texas for health benefits for 
Mrs. Mosley.

Mrs. Clyde Hudson and Mrs. 
Mattie Hudson of Goodnight were 
in Clarendon Wed. afternoon.
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Dr. Keith S. Lowell
GENERAL PRACTICE 

AND SURGERY
Offices in Goldston Bldg. 

Offico Phono 12$ 
Raaidanca Phona 174

-M- SYSTEM
For BETTER QUALITY and SAVINGS

TOP PRICES FOR EGGS

SMALL TIRE DEALERS 
EXEMPTED FROM 
INVENTORY

Tire dealers who had in stock 
on December 31 less than six pas­
senger car tires and no truck tires 
or tubes need not file the quarter­
ly inventory report called for on 
that date, the Office of Price Ad­
ministration said today. About 40 
per cent of all dealers are affected, 
OPA estimated.

The smaller dealers are being 
exempted from the inventory re­
quirement so as to simplify the re­
porting procedure both for OPA 
and the trade. The exemption cov­
ers all dealers having no truck or 
bus tires or tubes, and having less 
than six passenger tires on hand, 
in transit, or on consignment, on 
December 31. If a dealer has any 
truck tires or tubes, however, he 
must file a complete report.

GREEN BEANS
Pound . \ ....................................... 18c NEW JUICY

CARROTS
Bunch ................................................... 7c SPUDS ORANGES
GREEN ONIONS
B unch...................................................I • 9c POUND

5c
DOZEN

20cLARGE CELERY
Bunch ................................................ 18c

LEMONS
DOZEN

JUICY

Grapefruit
>q

DOZEN

45c

FRESH PINEAPPLE
Each .........................

RED SPUDS
10 lbs. .........

COFFEE
Maxwell House—1 lb. Bag

. 61c
^ 9 c

32c
WHITE CORN MEAL
5 lb e .....................25 i 10 lbs. 45c

RAKING POWDER
Clabber Girl—2 lbs. 24c

* Clarendon Clinic |  
J Hospital Notes J

New arrivals:
Mrs. Hazel Friend, Hedley, a 

girl; Mrs. E. L. Littlefield, Jericho, 
a boy; Mrs. Will Chamberlain, 
Clarendon, a boy; Mrs. Roy Jack- 
son, Lelia Lake, a girl.
Medical:

Mrs. Roy Dougherty, Hedley; 
Mary Alice Allison, Clarendon; 
Billy Bradshaw, Clarendon; Mrs. 
Ernest Christie and baby, McLean; 
L. R. Dean, Clarendon; Gene Me 
Braycr; Mrs. T. L. Spier, Claren­
don; A. L. Sandridge, Giles. 
Surgical:

Mrs. Thelma Holcomb, Claren­
don; Mrs. Joyce Jacobs, Alanreed; 
Sara Beth Lowry, Clarendon.

CAKE FLOUR
Swantdown—Box ..................................... 25c
SUNSHINE CRACKERS
Crispy—2 lb. Box .................................... 29c
PEANUT BUTTER
Quart Jar ................ 55c

DRIED

RAISINS
2 lbs.

28c

PURE-SNO

FLOUR
25 lb. Sack

$125

Crystal White Laundry

SOAP
6 Bars

25c

MOTHERS

OATS
BOX

SLICED CURED HAM
Pound .................. 35c

Mr. and Mrs. D. E. Holt and 
children spent the week end with 
her mother, Mr. and Mrs. Karl 
Adams.

Mr. and Mrs. R. S. Moss of 
Amarillo were down Friday visit­
ing friends and attending Income 
Tax matters.

CHEESE
Pound 42c
SLICED BACON
Pound .................................................. 34c
OLEOMARGARINE
Pound .............. 19c

GOOD BROOMS
Each....................................... ................. 85c
BULK COOKIES
Pound.......................  .......... ................. 29c
Have New Shipment Garden Seed j

PURE CANE SYRUP
Vi'gal. Jar ............................. .................. 65c |

TENDER

Beef Roast
POUND

2%c

ARMOUR'S

TREET
ail purposs moat (5 pts.)

12 os. Can

35c |
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT THE AMOUNT OF ANY ITEMS.

ffl


