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Schools Successful 
In Jeep Bond Drive

By Billie Nell Warren
The Jeep Bond Drive has been 

very successful throughout the 
State of Texas. The schools of 
Clarendon have taken a part in 
the drive and worked at it very 
enthusiastically. All the students 
seem to be proud of the fact that 
they can buy stamps and bonds, 
not only to help their own broth­
ers and sweethearts, but all the 
boys who have gone from our 
schools to fight to help make it 
possible for the rest of us to fin­
ish our education and live as free 
Americans.

The highest point of interest 
concerning the drive was a pro­
gram presented in the College 
Auditorium Friday, April 16th. 
The program, arranged by Miss 
Berry, the Home Economics in­
structor, is as follows:

Presentation of the Flags—Bob 
Bently and Jean Porter.

Star Spangled Banner — Group 
accompanied by Mrs. Turner.

Flag History—Bob Bently and 
Jean Porter?

Presentation of Service Flag— 
Bill Andis.

Reading: “The Service Flag— 
Billie ^^$n Knox.

Melody of Patriotic Songs— 
“MariAonHymn", “Caisson Song,” 
“Anchors Aweigh,” "Army Air 
Corps,” “Over There”, — Girl’s 
Quartette: Billie Nell Warren, 
Jean Williams, Frances Phelps. 
Katherine May, accompanied by 
Dorothy Kennedy.

Group singing — Miss Stevens 
Second Grade, accompanied by 
Mrs. Bryan.

Radio skit—“Tis My Country” 
—Written? by Ida Mae Wiedman.
The cast: Vlctdr Smith, and Har­
old Donnell.

One Act Play — “Everybody’s 
War”— Written by Frances Ad­
kins.

The Cast
Mrs. Fields . Charline Knox
Mr. Fields ............ G. D. Shelly
Aunt Agatha Buena Walker 
Jackie Fields .. Jack Ballew 
Senor Juarez W. G. Adams
Maid ^Joan Hillman
There was an approximate total 

of $42,108.05 worth'of bonds and 
stamps bought during the drive.

There was also a Band Rally 
held In town Saturday evening for 
the benefit of the people who 
wanted to buy stamps and bonds.

If you haven’t already done so, 
invest a part of your income to­
day in war bonds and stamps. It 
will not only help you, but also 
the government. This drive will 
be continued until the twenty- 
first of April.

MEETS NAVY BUDDY 
AFTER 32 YEARS

Coming down town early this 
Thursday morning, R. R. Dawkins
met a man in service uniform 
whose face looked strangely fa­
miliar. He talked with this man, 
and in a few moments discovered 
that he had served in the navy 
with him back in 1911. The two 
ate breakfast together and enjoy­
ed talking over old times. The 
visitor has two sons in the service, 
and is himself in the service, but 
not the navy. He was too old for 
the naval requirements, hence 
joined the land forces.

After all, recognizing the fea­
tures of a navy buddy after 32 
years is some feat.

FARMERS WHO SELL 
TO RETAILERS

A farmer who sells butter, lard 
or any oth%r rationed food to a re­
tailer must collect ration points 
for the sale, just as he has done in 
selling to consumers since March 
29th. All farm sales must be made 
at current point values and 
stamps collected must be turned 
in to local ration boards with a re­
port mode or. CPA Pom* R-I5S. 
This form will be available to all 
local boards during the last week 
in April.

Soldiers Camped 
In Clarendon 
Over Night

What the citizens of this section 
missed in the regular camp by 
neWr having visited one, saw 
some six hundred uniformed men 
here Wednesday afternoon and 
night with all the trimmings.

They were from many states, 
yet each was dignified and re­
spective and left our people think­
ing all the better of them and re­
gretting that they left at 5 a. m. 
this Thursday morning.

The service men took advantage 
of the cafe service and cold drinks 
they found here. Meat and bread 
becqme scarce 'hey waded into 
those commodities with nothing 
short of a soldier’s appetite.

Some of the soldiers are still 
here and may remain a few days 
while doing general practice. It 
was learned that camps are over­
flowing with recruits to the ser­
vice, and thousands over the na­
tion are being trained in field 
practice by moving them from 
place to place because of a lack of 
room in the camps.

The camp ground is located on 
the hill southwest of the Junior 
High School building. Visitors 
are welcome. The service men 
were shown every courtesy by 
our citizens. The local High 
School band played for the boys 
fn uniform and hundreds of local 
people visited the camp.

Second War Loan Campaign Requires 
Coordination of Great and Small 
Financial Factors to Reach Quota

Homer C. Speed 
Receives Wings 
As Bombardier

Huge new classes of young 
Americans who have spent twelve 
weeks raining practice bombs on 
replicas of enemy ships, dock in­
stallations, truck convoys, oil re­
fineries and munitions factories 
today took the first step toward 
the real thing as graduation exer­
cises for bombardier “Hell from 
Heaven Men” were held simultan­
eously at the three schools of the 
vast West Texas Bombardier 
Triangle.

Among those receiving silver 
bombardier wings and commiss­
ions as second lieutenants in the 
Army Air Forces is Second Lieut. 
Homer Chas. Speed of this city. 
He is a son of Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Speed of this place and is an 
alumnus of Clarendon Junior Col­
lege, 1938-'39. Lt. Speed was 
graduated from the San Angelo 
Bombardier School

WORKERS CONFERENCE
Those attending the monthly 

Worker's Conference at the Eli 
church Tuesday afternoon and 
evening wele Rev. and Mrs. E. L. 
Moody, and Mmes. A. W. Simp­
son, Hattie Wallace, Lola Bams, 
Van Kennedy.

Out of the 13 billion dollars now 
being loaned to their government 
by millions of Americans may 
come a giant warship costing $97,- 
000,090 or a bean pot, costing 29 
cents.

Somewhere in between, your 
money from current income or 
savings which you are converting 
into Government Bonds duripg 
this Second War Loan campaign, 
fits in.

Your money is helping literally 
to place a shield around our fight­
ing men. Your money helped to 
blast the Japanese off Guadal­
canal and is helping to push Rom­
mel into the African seas.

Every salvo fired by the nine 
16 inch guns of a battlewagon to 
soften the way for the Marines 
as they stormed into the Solomons 
cost $13,500. Their landing barges 
cost $12,500 each. The immediate

REV. L. GUY AMENT 
• - - popular pastor of the local 
First Christian Church who is con- 
ducting his own revival this week. 
Rev. Ament reports a good attend­
ance and invites the public to 
come out and hear his messages.

h a r r y  M cCr a c k e n
ASSIGNED TO 
NEW JOB

S/Sgt. Harry K. McCracken, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. B. F. McCracken 
of near McLean, Texas, was a- 
mong a large group of factory 
trained airplane mechanics just 
assigned to the Dodge City army 
air field, big new B-26 Marauder 
flying school now ready to train 
student-officer pilots.

Fishing Season 
Opens May 1st a t 
Lake McClellan

Anglers will have their day 
soon as the fishing season opens 
Saturday, May 1st. This year the 
State laws governing this part of 
the state have been changed, plac­
ing this section in with the rest of 
the state.

Lake McClellan, which has had 
a late start in previous years, 
steps up and will open under the 
regular state regulations.

Bert Howell, concessionaire at 
the lake, states that they are all 
ready over there and have every­
thing tnat a fisherman needs to 
try his luck. A large stock of min­
nows. worms and other bait is on 
hand and plenty of fishing boats 
with motel's or without, are all 
tuned up ready to go.

So all of you who have had the 
fever for quite some time will 
have a chance to satisfy your de­
sire by being there at your favor­
ite fishing spot bright and early 
Saturday morning of the First.

School Pageant To  
Honor Old Glory In 
Story And Song
DON TOMLINSON IS 
REPORTED MISSING

Word was received from the 
War Department Tuesday that 
Don Tomlinson, son of Mrs. M. 
Tomlinson, was missing since 
March 31st in the North African 
engagement. •

Don entered- the armed services 
in March, 1942. He was attached 
to a tank division there.

SUGAR FOR CANNING 
THIS SEASON

Sugar for home-canning of 1943 
fruit crops will be available to 
housewives on approximately the 
same basis as last season. No de­
duction of blue point stamps will 
be made from War Ration Book 
Two for canning sugar.

Chairman Judge J. R. Porter 
announced this morning that acj 
cording to tabulationa on sales up 
through Wednesday, a total of 
$73,200 (sale price) in bonds had 
been sold. The maturity value of 
the sales would amount to $81.- 
500. but according to information, 
our quota of $208,000 is based on 
the sal* price, so this leaves more 
than half the amount or $134,800 
yet to be subscribed.

Mr. Porter reported also that a 
Bond Rally, sponsored by the 
Hedley Lions Club, would be held 
tonight at Hedley at the school 
house. Those people down there 
propose to show everyone that 
they are really in it. and will 
bring up Hadley’s share of the 
big drive.

personal equipment of each Ma­
rine cost $155.94. From the mo­
ment he went into action the costs 
began to mount. His pay was 20 
per cent higher. He began using 
ammunition and other equipment. 
Every anti-airfract shell he fired 
cost $5.43 and every 75 mm. pack 
howitzer shell he hurled at the 
enemy ate up $15.14.

In other words, every piece of 
equipment used by our fighting 
men costs money and plenty of it. 
Your War Bond purchases help to 
pay for the enormous amount of 
supplies, food and equipment 
which our fighting men must have 
from now on. Not only must they 
have plenty to eat and plenty

of equipment to fight with, but 
there must be planes and ships to 
back them up.

Every individual in Donley 
county must realize toe respon­
sibility that rests with us on the 
home front. We must buy more 
and more bonds, and not take for 
granted that the other fellow will 
do all the buying. We must make 
it an individual proposition and 
buy as many bonds as possible.

Wc just have a little more than 
a week to fill oar quota of $208,- 
000 here in Donley county. This 
means that some one must buy 
more bonds than they had expect­
ed to buy. Don’t let your money 
lie idle—let it fight for freedom.

Feeding Time For 
Laying Hens •

The afternoon is preferred by 
many poultrymen as the time for 
feeding the heavy grain ration to 
laying hens. Some of them start 
the day by feeding grain in the 
proportion of two pounds to one 
hundred hens in the forenoon. 
This practice, says H. M. Breed­
love, County Agent for the A&M 
College Extension Service, is 
helpful if the day is cold. But the 
afternoon is his choice for the ma­
jor grain feeding, especially for 
flocks of one hundred to two hun­
dred fowls. He suggests using ten 
pounds to one hundred layers.

Breedlove recommends that 
grain be fed on top of the mash 
and not on the ground. Spreading 
it on the ground invites worm in­
festation. Grain is fed primarily to 
maintain the body weight of hens. 
But overfeeding r  just as injur­
ious as underfeeding. Overfeeding 
reAilts in low egg production, ex­
cessively fat birds, and death in 
many cases. The proportion of ten 
pounds to one hundred hens is a 
good average, it can be adjusted 
slightly up or down to fit the 
needs of individual flocks.

The time o f  feeding, however, 
is not the whole problem. The aim 
of good feeding is. good produc­
tion. Unless hens pay off in eggs 
they are not worth expenditure of 
the scarce, costly feed. Breedlove 
suggests that hens not paying for 
their keep should be culled out 
promptly and turned over to the 
family meat supply.

ALL TEACHERS 
RE-ELECTED

According to a report from the 
school board of Trustees, every 
teacher in the system was re­
elected for another year and that 
an increase of 10% in salary was 
voted. An additional 3% bonus 
will also be given to each teacher 
if they complete the entire year 
here.
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

DEFENSE PRODUCTION COURSES 
NOW IN PROGRESS AT MARTIN

* Clarendon Clinic *
* Hospital Notes *
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦
Surgery:

Mrs. W. A. Pierce, Mrs. Roy Mc­
Kee, Hedley; Mrs. Glenn Bernard, 
Memphis; Miss Nina Rhea Vinson, 
Hedley.
Medical:

Mrs. E. M. McQueen, Hedley: 
Mrs. Fred Hardie.

RURRFR T'RES WILL 
REPLACE STEEL WHEELS

Texas farmers who have pur­
chased tractors and other imple­
ments with steel wheels since 
May 1, 1942, now may convert to 
rubber tires, the Texas USDA 
War Board has announced.

Purpose of the action which is 
being taken by the USDA, OPA 
and Office of the Rubber Director, 
is to help farmers increase effic­
iency of their operations at a time 
when maximum results must be 
obtained from farm equipment.

County OPA War Price and Ra­
tioning Boards will authorize the 
conversions on the basis of certifi­
cation of individual farmer's ap­
plications by county USDA War 
Boards.

RETURNS HOME
Mrs. A. H. Baker returned home 

Sunday from a two months visit 
with her daughter, Mr. and Mbs. 
Rush at San Antonio. Mrs. Rush 
brought her home and will be 
here for a short visit.

The first of a'series of Defense 
Production meetings was held at 
Martin Tuesday night with ap­
proximately thirty-five members 
of that community in attendance. 
The courses dealing with produc­
tion problems are sponsored by 
the Donley County War Bourd in 
cooperation with the State De­
partment of Vocational Agricul­
ture. Miss Maurice Berry, Claren­
don High School Home Economics 
Instructor, is rrieetiug with the 
ladies of the community and J. R. 
Gillham, Clarendon High School 
Vocational Agriculture Instructor 
is meeting with the men.

Rations for Dairy cattle, poul­
try, beef cattle, hogs, selection 
and management of the various 
types of livestock, and treatment 
and control of diseases of live­
stock and poultry will form the 
major topics of discussion in the 
men’s meetings. Demonstrations 
on contagious abortion tests, 
treating of ruptures and other 
similar conditions in livestock, 
and treatment of parasites will 
also be given.

A number of educational films 
have been secured by the instruc­
tors and will be shown at the 
meetings. The course meets on 
Tuesday and Thursday nights of 
each week, and everyone is invit­
ed to attend.

MEAT CEILINGS 
POSTPONED

Maximum prices on beef, veal, 
lamb, and mutton sold at retail 
will not become effective until 
May 17. OPA suspended ceilings 
scheduled to go into effect April 
15 in order to be sure that the 
prices were in line with other liv­
ing costs.

"They Give Their Lives— You Lend Your Money”
U. S. Trtatury Dtparlrntnl

WAR COSTS GO 
HIGHER

A new high of more than 7 bil­
lion dollars was reached in war 
expenditures during March, when 
the average amount spent each 
day was $263,400:000. To meet 
these mounting costs of war. Sec­
retary of the Treasury Morgen- 
thau recently disclosed that the 
13 pillion dollar second war loan 
is part of 70 billion dollars that 
must be raised during 1943.

CPL. O. J. MELTON 
GRADUATED

Another class of skilled tank 
mechanics, trained to keep the 
big General Shermans, General 
Grants, and their little brothers, 
the light tanks, roaring into com 
bat, had been graduated today 
from the Armored Force School 
Tank Department at Fort Knox, 
Kentucky.

Among those graduated was 
Cpl. O. J. Melton, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom L  Melton of this city.

The cause of Old Glory will be 
told in song and story in the 
school pageant that will be pre­
sented at the football park Friday 
evening of this week, beginning at 
nine o’clock.

In the opening number the band 
will play patriotic airs as “Uncle 
Sam" enters. This will be follow­
ed by the crowning of three 
queens, one from each of the 
schools. Uncle Sam officiating.

In this dramatic ceremony will 
be represented soldier, sailor, 
marine, followed by doctor, nurse 
and stretcher bearer. Illustrating 
the importance of food and cloth­
ing production, next in line be­
hind tla; fighting men will come 
the farmer and rancher. Merchant, 
secretary, preacher and teacher 
next are seen in the illustration of 
the “line to he'd the enemy.”

Boy Scouts and Girl Scouts, too, 
will share in this pageant, repre­
senting coming America.

Uncle Sam and his court will 
then be entertained.

In the first scene, early ele­
mentary and games of children 
and dancing

The second scene will show 
physical development in dancing 
by high school und college groups.

In the third scene the Junior 
High School will take over. You 
will be in for a pleasant surprise 
here.

The Fifth and Sixth grades will 
appear in a flag drill in the Fourth 
scene.

Schottische and rope jumping 
when childhood's most happy
school days are extant will be 
shown in the fifth scene.

The colored school group will 
entertain in the sixth scene, bring­
ing a display of dancing rythm 
for which that race is famous.

No pageant could be complete 
without military drill and calcs- 
thenics, both of which will be 
abundantly shown in the seventh 
scene.

In the grand finale a flag meas­
uring 40 by 70 feet will be raised 
at this juncture of the program. A 
spotlight will bring out all the 
beauty in Old Glory. This will call 
for the pledge of allegiance by the 
assembly.

Every school child, white and 
colored, will share in the pageant. 
Some fifty adults will take a part. 
Dean R. E. Drennan of the Col­
lege, will read a very timely and 
appropriate script over the public 
address system. This information 
will be appreciated since it ex­
plains and supports all the activi­
ties of the evening. There will be 
no admission charge.

Don't forget the hour. The hour 
of nine is a bit late, but was 
chosen so as to not interfere with 
the revival services now in pro­
gress at the First Christian 
church, the Leader has been in­
formed.

The Donley County War Price 
and Rationing Board, today an­
nounced that on Friday, May 7. a 
meeting will be held at 8:30 p. m. 
in Clarendon at Court House, 
with representatives of retail and 
wholesale food dealers. This meet 
ing will be conducted by Mr. H. 
Theodore Gehring, Price Special­
ist of the Lubbock District Office, 
of the Office of Price Administra­
tion, who will explain and discuss 
in detail the provisions of the new 
simplified food regulations. As 
this is a matter of t  ramount im­
portance, all those engaged in the 
wholesale and retail food business 
are urged to attend, and to bring 
up at the meeting any problems 
which they have. This is an un­
usual opportunity for the mer­
chants concerned to get first hand 
information on a subject which 
vitally affects their business.

COMES BACK TO , j ■*
OLD DONLEY

Arriving a few days ago was 
Floyd Little who has been in the 
service for several months. He 
trained in Arizona and Washing* 
ton states. Only recently, he be­
came a physical discharge. He 
states that it his intention to aid 
the cause through his working in 
a war plant of some kind from 
here out.

-5PRESSURE COOKERS 
TO BE RATIONED ft

Pressure cookers have beer 
placed under rationing orders anc 
will be distributed through loca 
farm rationing committees whicl 
already are rationing farm ma 
chinery and supplies, according ti 
the Texas USDA War Board

County quotas will not be es 
tablished, according to presen 
plans, but eligible participant 
must assure county farm ration 
ing committees that cookers cai 
be obtained before purchase cei 
tificates are issued.

< = 7
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OUR SURPLUS MANPOWER IS N O T YET COMPLETE

There are things we come back to, every tim e we read 
stories concerning the search the governm ent is m aking for 
m anpower.

F irst those on critical jobs are  not working long enough 
hours and second that many favored spots are being kept im­
m une from search.

We have never believed tha t in war, an American that 
w orked a short week could cope with an enemy that worked 
slave labor around the clock.

We believe that the  trem endous cost of our construction 
program  on the present- wage scale and cost plus basis, is one 
of the most sure causes of inflation which everyone professes 
to dread and the most dangerous factor of weakness in our 
long range ability to carry on the war effort.

We believe that the man on a defense job, could work 48 
to  54 hours with overtim e at the regular rate  of pay now in 
effect on such jobs and make far less contribution to his coun-

try ’s defense, far less sacrifice financially, than his b ro ther in 
uniform.

Our costs are  far outstirpping those of both our enemies 
and allie^. Our tax  program  m ounts up and up and our nation­
al debt soars w ith it.

Hence, in a long struggle, the thing is going to be a factor 
in civilian m orale and econon.:c strength, which we m ust have
to carry  on the war.

Secondly we will sym pathize more w ith the  woes of the 
M anpower Commission, when they m ake available for w ar 
work the m anpow er now tied up, in governm ent agencies. .

In every town of any size in America, you can find farm  
agencies, housing agencies, ren t control agencies and every 
conceivable breeder of soft jobs, w ith huge coffee and coca 
cola drinking, tim e killing staffs, idling aw ay as though Uncle 
Sam and God owed them  a living and they  w ere m erely ac­
cepting their ju st dues.

There is no use talking. W e cannot afford this bunch of 
parasites Any longer and they should be placed on a job where 
they can do some good. They are  using money, tim e and m an 
power, needed elsew here and if they  are  allowed to keep rid­
ing Uncle Sam ’s coattails a t a tim e w hen we need all the  help 
we can get, then  we have not yet realized the m eaning and 
size of our task.—Bill R utherford, Editor Moore County News.

Health Dept. 
Offers Hints 
On Safety

Some timely advice to vacation­
ists and picnickers was released 
Iron-, the State Health Depart­
ment today by Dr. Geo. W. Cox. 
State Health Officer.

It was pointed out that, in view 
of wartime restrictions, vacation 
pleasures are apt to be limited to 
excursions and picnics at nearby 
lakes, rivers, and ponds of un­
familiar d«^)ths and currents, and 
without the usual lifeguard super­
vision associated with bathing 
beaches and commercial swim­
ming pools. «

THE OILS WAR LOAN DRI VE IS ON!

Come on.
Lets Will this war!

“Swimming and water sports 
are beneficial to good health pro­
vided one’s physical condition 
justifies this type of exercise," Dr. 
Cox asserted, “nevertheless, they 
possess dangerous possibilities if 
the rules of safety are disregard 
ed.’’

The following simple rules for 
bathing and swimming in safety 
were suggested: at least one hour 
should elapse after a meal before 
entering the water; never dive in­
to unfamiliar waters; upon the 
first indication of fatigue, come 
ashore and don’t re-enter the wa­
ter; leave the water immediately, 
if chilled; do not enter the water 
when overheated; learn to float; 
never attempt to rock a boat in a 
spirit of fun; never swim in water 
that may be polluted.

“Excursions, oicnics, and swim­
ming parties contribute much to a 
healthy happy, normal life, which 
is especially dcfirabl*? thin nnr 
ticular time .when the whole na­
tion is under the strain of war,” 
Dr. Cox said “It is by no means 
advisable to eliminate these ex­
cursions from our summer pro­
gram, but it is important that they 
prove beneficial and not disas­
trous.

GRAPEVINE
-By Grady Haslewood

★  ★  ★  ★  ★ ★  ★  ★  ★  ★

IF we should lose the war, life would not 
be worth living.

’’But we won’t lose It,” you may say*

Listen, brother—in this world nothing’* 
sure, unless you make it so.

This month it’s up to us here at home to 
do our part, and then some, to make Victory 
surer—and quicker! To do it, we’ve got to 
lend Uncle Sam 13 billion extra dollars.

It isn’t easy—but war isn’t easy and Vic­
tory isn’t cheap. It takes money—and more 
money—to buy planes, ships, tanks, guns 
and a million other things our boys must 
have to deliver that final, paralyzing knock­
out punch.

And it’s a whale of a lot easier for us at 
home to lend our money than for our boys 
to fight through the hardships and dangers 
of deserts, swamps, jungles, ice-fields and 
sub-infested seas!

Just think! Every extra bond you buy will 
help provide the weapons to save the livea 
of many American boys! Isn’t that alone 
worth every effort, every economy you can 
make? You bet it is!

There are 7 types of U. S. Government 
securities to meet the needs of every purse. 
They offer the finest investment in the world 
—liberal interest, plus securities guaranteed 
by Uncle Sam himself.

A volunteer worker for the 2nd War Loan 
Drive may visit you soon. Welcome this 
unselfish patroit—and buy all the bonds 
you can. But don’t wait for that calL G o -  
today—to your bank, investment dealer, 
broker, post office or bond booth and inveat 
to your uttermost limit Even if it hurts, it’s 
nothing compared to the agonizing impact 
of a bayonet thrust, a flesh-tearing torpedo 
fragment or a bone-crushing bullet

So dig deep, brother, and do it NOW!

One slice of bread molds, one 
carrot shrivels—multiply that by 
the Nation's 34 ̂ Bullion homes. 
Fight food waste oft the home 
front

Keep bread and cake in venti­
lated containers, scalded, sunned, 
and aired once a week.

After considerable debate, many 
jibes at the Liquor Control P>otrd, 
and a few amendments, the re­
write of the liquor laws of Texas 
by Senator George Moffett was 
passed through the Senate by the 
almost unanimous vote of#23 to 1. 
Heretofore either minors or aliens 
could procure liquor licenses. Al­
so, the Liquor Board could close a 
bar or honky tonk and a C3W 
license in another name could be 
procured immediately, with the 
result that operation of such plac­
es continue without interruption. 
This was corrected so that here­
after when any such place is clos­
ed it will remain closed regardless 
of ownership for a period of six 
months, thus incurring consider­
able financial loss to the owner of 
the property. Election machinery 
was revised in some mi-ar ye- 
spects but the one year period be­
tween elections remains the law. 
There had been some division a- 
mong prohibition forces in this re­
gard. The bill as passed carried 
the official endorsement of the 
Texas United Dry Group.

Passed by a very decisive vote 
last week was another rather rigid 
control act commonly referred to 
in newspapers as the “Curfew 
Law”. The votes in the Senate and 
the House on these two bills bears 
out the earlier prediction made in 
this column that the dry forces 
would have their way at this 
sessioa

* • •
This week the Senate refused to 

concur in House amendments to 
the “Fire Murchison” bill by the 
writer and asked for a free con­
ference committee. The House 
amended the bill taking the ap­
pointing power away from the 
Board of Public Welfare and plac­
ed it with the Governor. It was 
rumored that the Governor would 
have none of this, and newspapers 
m i n t e d  Lieutenant Governor John 
Lee Smith, aspirant to the gov­
ernor’s office at some future date, 
as also being opposed to i t  The, 
old age assistance problem is 
much discussed but no one wants 
anything to do with i t  Executive 
Director Murchison is Texas’ larg­
est single spender, having $42- 
,000,000.00 per year which he 
expends for old age assistance and 
administrative purposes. Every­
one remembers that it was he who 
raised his salary $1,000.00 per year 
ana the salaries of his department 
$60,000.00 per year. Incidentally, 
the old age assistance division oc­
cupies the most elaborate and 
most expensive air conditioned of­

fices in Austin. The grapevine is 
that the Board of Public Welfare 
is not going to give the Senate a 
chance to fire Murchison by re­
fusing to confirm him, but will 
name another man for the place 
before the free conference com­
mittee can act. Rumor has it that 
three men have already been so­
licited for the position and all 
three have refused it, all of which 
further indicates how wary every­
one seems to be about this depart­
ment

SAFE CANNING 
METHODS

The steam pressure canner is 
the only method recommended by 
the’U. S. Department of Agricul­
ture for preserving certain types 
of vegetables. Such vegetables as 
beans, peas, corn, spinach, and as­
paragus, as well as meats, should 
be cooked in a steam pressure 
canner to kill organisms which 
cause food to spoils Fruits and to­
matoes, rhubarb, and pickled 
beets may be safely canned by the 
boiling water-bath method. To be 
safe, these products should be 
boiled for at least ten minutes be­
fore they are eaten or tasted, 
even though there is no sign of 
spoilage when the jar is opened.

P A S TIM E
T H E A T R E
MATINEES— SAT. St SUN. 

and HOLIDAYS 
Begins at 2:00 p. m.

----- OTHER DAYS-----
/Shows Begin at 5:30. 7i30. 9:30

FRIDAY A SATURDAY 

APRIL 23-24th  

Errol Flynn and Aloxia Smith

“Gentlem an Jim »»

Donley County Leader, 52 a year.

Dr. J . Gordon Stewart
PHYSICIAN A SURGEON

Office in Latson Bldg 
Ground Floor*

Office Phone 230 

Residence Phone 253

INSURANCE
FIRE •  TORNADO •  HAIL •  A U TO

AND ALL KINDRED LINES

BONDS •  NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
Phone 11 C. C. Powell

i m n m u u n n

DR. H. R. BECK
D E N T I S T

Phone 40

9 to 12—Office hours—1 to 5 

Goldaton Bldg.

Cleren den, T«

Cartoon

11— 254

SATURDAY PREYUE 

SUNDAY A MONDAY 

APRIL 24-26th

Monty Woolley 

and

Ida Lupi^o

“Life Begins At 

Eight Thirty”
4 -

Short Subs.

VI— 304

J . A. WARREN
AGENCY

writing all lines of insurance 
except fire.§

HOSPITALIZATION
INSURANCE

Legal forms, bookkeeping, 
audits, income tax aerrioa. 

General office and clerical work. 
209 Goldaton Bldg. 
Clarendon. Texas

T ltr t  JT0 7 different types ej U. S. Government securities— cheese the ones best suited for yon!

THEY GIVE THEIR LIVES . . .  YOU LEND YOUR MONEY!

The Donley County State Bank 
The Farmers State Bank

Committee — War Savings Staff — Victory Fund Committee

<?u$

Wax' restrictions have turned  out to be a 
good thing by causing people to. invest 
their money in Q uality Clothes that will 
last. T hat’s w hy m ore and m ore men a re  
turning to B ryan’s. Let us help you 
choose your new Spring suit. We have 
the  latest patterns and styles for sum ­
m er wearing.

To complete your Blaster outfit, you can
do it all righ t h e re ---- and w ith the best.
We have a complete stock of Wilson and 
Arrow shirts, ties and socks.

MALLORY and STETSON HATS

. FLORSHEIM, JARMAN AND 
FORTUNE SHOES

BRYAN CLOTHING CO.
MEN’S WEAR

T U E S D A Y  

APRIL 27th 

Donald Barry and Jaan Parker

‘T h e  T raitor W ithin”
also Short Subs.

♦

Batyain Day— VJ-IJg

WEDNESDAY A THURSDAY 

and FRIDAY. APRIL 28-30

GARY

COOPER

“The Pride Of 

The Yankees”
Naws

IV— 304

— C O M I N G —

"Andy Hardy's Doubla Llf*"

COZY THEATRE

S A T U R D A Y * '  

APRIL 24th  

. GENE AUTRY

“ Bells of Capistr&na”
Chapter 10 of

"Valley of Vanishing Man”

IV— 20#
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♦  e
♦  T H t TEMPLE O f TRUTH  ♦
♦ • ♦
♦  By tlM Apostle ♦
♦ ♦

OUR FATHERS.
Fathers whose sons are on for­

eign soil in the battle area don’t 
say a great deal about i t  They

those same fathers, and especially 
tho^e whose sons have died on the 
field of honor, could only pour 
their hate tnrough the hot barrels 
of smoking guns, and ivrite the 
records of their grief with bayonet 
steel, there would be worlds of 
satisfaction in the act.

♦  ♦  ♦
RIGHTS.

The right to live in a free coun­
try. The right to worship as I

please. The right to think and vote 
as I think best. The right to be in­
dustrious and honest. The right to 
hope and pray for an early victory 
and unconditional surrender of 
the enemy. Lastly, the right to 
buy war bonds and stamps. These 
are but a few of the rights I en­
joy every day. It’s great to be an 
American in the hom'e land. Let’s 
not forget our Americans “over 
there” who do not have all these

rights in the battle area that we 
enjoy here at home. Buy bonds so 
the boys can bomb ’em.

♦  ♦  ♦

DON'T CROW.
A neighbor says to me, he says, 

“don’t crow too soon over your 
Victory Garden. Your neighbor’s 
rooster may do thatl”

♦  ♦  ♦  
PROPHECY,

Recently, so the story goes, a
mmmmm»mmr , • - ■■H 3

d & W  B E TTE R  M EALS vYC*.'. ' l A J A

FRESH SPINACH
2 Pounds......... ............................................. 15c
CARROTS
3 Bunchss ............................................ 9c
SQUASH
Yollow or Whita—P ound................. 10c
GREEN BEANS
1 Pound ....... ............................................... 15c
ORANGES
Florida—D ozen........................................ 30c

B O L O G N A

(6 points)—lb ..................

NEW SPUDS
2 Pounds ....... 15c

OLEOMARGARINE

(5 points)—lb ... 23c
HOT BARBECUE SATURDAY

FRESH FISH IF POSSIBLE

MAGIC WASHING POWDER

Two reg. 27c Boxm .45
SPAGHETTI Mad« from hard wheat

2 lb. Box .25
FLOUR = " $1.98
SYRUP BRER R&BBIT 

Table syrup 

1 g a llo n .............. .69
SWAN SOAP
2 large B a rs............................... 21c CRACKERS

Sods—2 lbs.................................. 17c
COFFEE
Admirstion—1 pound ............ 33c MIL-NOT

It Whip*—2 large cans 18c
SHORTENING
Mrs. Tucker—3 pounds .......... 63c KRE-MEL

2 Pkgs............................................ 15c
Lighthouse Cleanser Q c
2 Cans ..............................................................................

GRAPE JUICE
Watch's—1 quart ....................... 48c

EGG NOODLES
5V4 os. Pkg ............................... 10c SOUR PICKLES

1 Q uart........................................ 25c
DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT

•

Unbleached

DOMESTIC
Dress Hats

Children's end Boy's

Ladies Gowns

Cotton Crepe

GINGHAM
Sugar end Spice

14c and 21c
49c *» *2* $ 1 3 9

59c yd

Bleached 23c Orelay 39c yd

FARMERS EXCHANGE
*  GROCERIES & MARKET J - 4
Phone 63- J W E  D E L I V E R Phone 63” J

German general was asked when 
the war would end. The goose 
stepped around a bit and replied 
that “the war will end when we 
have the English eating rats, and 
we are already eating them.”

♦  ♦  ♦
SMART GUY.

“I want a shave,” said the dis­
gruntled old codger as he climbed 
into the barber’s chair. “No hair­
cut, no shampoo, bay rum, witch 
hazel, hair tonic, hot towels or 
face massage. I don’t want the 
manicurist holding my hand, or 
the bootblack monkeying with 
my feet. I don’t want to be brush­
ed off, and I’ll put my coat on my­
self. I just want a plain shave. 
Now do you understand that?” 
The barber ucver battled and eye, 
but he asked, “any lather, sir?”

♦  ♦  ♦
With that, the sign-off has ar­

rived. The jackpot is right up the 
hill, and it takes a lot of fertilizer 
to make a good garden. That isn’t 
so bad, except that the best thing 
to mix up with a war garden is 
plain old elbow grease. If you 
know what I mean. Fertilize with 
plain old elbow grease.

* M I D W A Y  ♦
Mrs. John Goldston

The new grandson of Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Harden arrived the 
past Monday in an Amarillo hos­
pital. The mother, Mrs. Sykes was 
returned to the Harden home this 
past week and is doing nicely, al­
so the son. The father, Mr. Sykes, 
who is in service training at Col­
lege Station, arrived Friday, re­
turning Sunday.

Kennedy Davis of Amarillo 
spent the week end with his par­
ents.

Betty John Goldston spent the 
week end with Ida Mae Wiedman.

The Midway ladies met at the 
Midway school house Thursday 
and tacked a wool quilt and quilt­
ed the one Mrs. Glen Williams 
pieced. Mrs. Williams donated iiie 
lining and Mrs. J. A. Meaders do­
nated two spools of thread. Ladies 
to quilt were Mrs. Bob Williams, 
Mrs. W. D. Higgins, Mrs. Dick 
Tomlinson, Mrs. Tomlinson Sr. of 
Lelia Lake, Mrs. Le Roy Luttrell, 
Mrs. Everett^ Stevensoa, Mrs.

M/RACCE
m u

FM Stf
For Your Home Decoration!

m iracle  wall fin ish

paste form 
98*

One coat of Kern-Tone Well 
COTer» w«ilpeper, brick, 

^jnbowd, painted surface*. 
Applies easily. Dries in one 
hour. Washable I

the Kem-Tont
ROLLER-KO/ITER

ONLY

Hulet Swiney, Mrs. Daught Swin- 
ney, Mrs. Odis Naylor of Sunny- 
view, Mrs. John Goldston. Mrs. 
W. K. Davis has pieced two more 
quilt tops and donated them to the 
Red Cross. The Midway ladies 
will meet the 3rd Thursday in 
May to quilt these.

Mrs. Margaret Cole and son 
Bobby left Thursday for Houston 
to visit her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Pittman. Mrs. Tiny Eddins 
and daughter of Martin accompa­
nied them.

Sgt. Hrold Longan arrived Sat. 
night for a ten day visit. He is 
from Camp in Louisiana.

Mrs. D. W. Tomlinson has mov­
ed to Clarendon. She is employed 
at the Piggly Wiggly grocery.

Mrs. Edith Longan went to Hed- 
ley Wednesday to help Mr. and 
Mrs. J. C. Longan move.

Mr. and Mrs. Nelce Roberson 
and flit, and Mrs. Ben Andis of 
Amarillo visited in the Longan 
home Sunday.

Mrs. W. C. Holland and Mrs. 
Buford Holland and Gene Cham, 
berlain and son Johnny visited in 
the Chamberlain home Sunday.

Mrs. Mary Sue Longan and chil­
dren and Miss Watts of Ashtola 
spent Saturday night with Mrs. 
Edith Longan.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Riley and Mr. 
and Mrs. Arthur Davis were guest 
in the W. K. Davis home Sunday.

Mrs. Johnny Stone is visiting 
her brother at Paducah.

Word has been received from 
Kenneth Stone that he has land 
ed overseas.

Miss Katie Meaders went to 
Amarillo Monday.

Mrs. Mamie Morman of Ama­
rillo has received word her hus­
band was seriously ill. Mr. Mor­
man is in the war service. Mrs.

Morman is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Dayton Shelton, and will 
be remembered by many friends. 
They resided at Memphis before 
moving to Amarillo a few years 
back.

Mrs. Morman took a plane im­
mediately to go to her husband.

Mrs. Tomlinson Sr. spent a few 
days in the Dick Tomlinson home 
the past week.

The Arthur Davis 'amily were 
ill the first of the week having 
been poisoned on some ice cream 
they had bought. .

The people of the Fairview 
community are planning to have a 
community dinner and Easter egg 
hunt at the Fairview school house 
next Sunday Easter. Each family 
is to bring a basket dinner. If pos­
sible they plan to have church. 
Everyone around is invited to 
bring dinner. Come and enjoy the 
Easter get-together.

M r and Mrs. Hefner celebrated 
Sunday with a birthday dinner 
Her brother, Mr. Wood and Miss 
Bernice Mann of Pampa were 
guests.

Mr. Naylor and Misses Minnie 
and Ava Naylor visited the Hef­
ner’s in the afternoon.

Mr. J. A Meaders, Miss Katie, 
Mary Ellen Williams and Mrs. 
Everett Stevenson and daughter 
Jaunulle went to Amarillo Satur­
day.

Sgt. and Mrs. D. W. Tomlinson 
spent Sunday with his parents.

Bombardiers at the world’s 
largest bombardier school, Mid­
land, Texas, not only are adept 
with the bombsight, but also re­
ceive navigational training.

The three C’s for meat conser­
vation: Clean; Cold; Covered.

B̂iiPitiKiiiHiiiaiaiM aiitBiiiaiE!

The Prep
SHAVE 

DeLuxe

You don’t need a brash when 
you use Kem-Tane. Just roll 
this miracle wall finish right
over your walls quickly, eaailv
smoothly—with the clever* 
new Kent-Tone Roller- Router.

K*tbT»m TRIMS

Kem-Tone Trine enhance the 
“•wty of Kero-Tone-finiehed 
walls. Gummed; aeinwsa 
ready . to  • use. el w  .
s a r - * -  *5<t *MC1 •

Thompson Bros. 
Company

Hardwire k  Farm Equipment 
CLARENDON H I tIBUT

CLEAN, COOL SHAVES
YE8, we take pride in pleasing 
you. Once you try our Prop Shave 
end feel the difference, you will 
always coma beck for the next 
shave. We will appreciate a visit 
from you. Let us prove it!

McGOWAN’S 
B arber Shop’ to P int Nsttoaal Beak

Science Will Build a  New World 
Are You Ready to Enjoy It?

Science will build a m arvelous w orld afte r the 

w ar. Cars, radios, refrigerators—scores of things 

will be unbelievably im proved. P re p a 'e  now to 

enjoy these conveniences to  come! P u t your 

money in W ar Bonds—and save for the  fu ture . 

Buy W ar Bonds and Stam ps a t th is bank.

Fa r m e r s  s t a t  i ? 
— b a n k — 1 |

gM tm btr F fd tu l Deposit Insurance C o rp o n tfo a
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MRS. DAUGHT SWINNEY 
HOSTESS TO WINDY 
VALLEY CLUB

The Club met April 14th. Two 
quilts were quilted.

The visitors were Mrs. Johnson, 
Mrs. Getsey and Minnie Noble.

Those receiving polly-anna gifts 
were Mrs. Harvey Shaw, Mrs. 
Marvin Crome and Mrs. Lacy 
Noble. Mrs. Lacy Noble was given 
a stork shower.

Those present were Mmes. C. C. 
Ayers, Bert Ayers, Boyde Wad­
dell, Carl Barker, Bob McCoy, 
John Hutson, Will Barker, Odell 
Barker, Lacy Noble, I. M. Noble, 
J. F. Kidd, Mamie Mills, Alta 
Angel, Mamie Brogdon, Daught 
Swinney, John Swinney, Harvey 
Shaw. Nelson Seago, Luke Crome, 
Marvin Orome and Cap Anderson.

The next meeting will be April 
28th. Mrs. Charlie Molder will be 
hostess.

192 BOOK CLUB
Members of this Club met in 

the home of Mrs. E. S. Ballew 
with Mrs. Rayburn Smith assist­
ing her as hostess to the members.

Mrs. L. N. Cox reviewed the 
book, "The Human Comedy," by 
Wm. Saruyan.

Guests included Mmes. J. O 
Quattlebaum, C. J. Van Zandt, 
Marguerite Goodner, Bertie Lea­
thers, Bill Bentley.

Twenty-six members were pres­
ent. Delicious refreshments were 
served.

Tulips in a profusion of bright 
colors were used for decoration.

COTTAGE PRAYEH 
MEETINGS

Met at the home of Mrs Me- 
Clenney Tuesday with 17 present. 
Rev. Ament read and explained 
the 17th chapter of John.

TM« SO M .iT  C'UM TT H A M S . I I . N  H I  V IA t.

1930 NEEDLE CLUB
Hattie Palmer entertained this 

club at her home Tuesday after­
noon. The entertaining rooms 
were decorated with lilacs and 
bridal wreath.

Sewing for the Red Cross was 
done during the afternoon.

A delicious salad course, carry­
ing out the Easter motif, was serv­
ed to guests, Mary Wallace and 
Marie Patterson; members, Mmes. 
Nora Decker, Alice Bain, Glynn 
Kirby, Nina Armstrong, Marguer­
ite Carpenter, Maggie Hunt. Marie 
Bell, Ona Tatum, and the hostess, 
Hattie Palmer.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH
J. J. Grubb*. Pastor

Sunday school—10 a. m. 
Preaching—11 a. m. and 7-30 p.m. 
Prayer Meeting, Wed.—7:30 p. m.

EPISCOPAL CHURCH OP 
ST. JOHN BAPTIST 

Rsv. Frank H. Hutchins, M. A~ 
Clergyman

Mr. Waltsr B. Knorpp.
Lay Rsadsr

Good Friday, April 23—12:00 noon 
Three-hour service, with Medita­
tions on the Seven Last Words. 
Easter Day, April 25—11:30 a. m. 
Holy Communion and Sermon. 

Everyone welcome at all services.

GARDEN CLUB
The first meeting of the Garden 

Club of the year will be Monday, 
April 26 at 3:30 p. m. in the home 
of Mrs. A. L. Chase.

PATHFINDER CLUB
The Pathfinder meeting will be 

postponed until Friday, April 30, 
on account of the death of Mrs. 
B. L. Jenkins. •

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express our thanks 

to our many loyal and true friends 
who helped us in our sadness. We 
thank God that such friends were 
ours in the passing of our dear 
loved one. We will remember you 
always. May God's blessings be 
yours is our ever prayer.

S. H. Lovell
C. H. Russell and Family.
Ea *1 F. Lovell and Family

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Hoy were 
over from Pampu Friday v?«ltina 
friends and attending to some 
business matters.

Miss Letha Warren returned 
home in Amarillo Tuesday after 
several days visit here with her 
parents.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rav. E. L. Moody, Pastor 
A. D. Estlack. S. S. Supt

Easter Sunday—April 25th.
Let us strive for 200 in Sunday 

school Sunday with every officer, 
teacher and pupil in his or her 
place. May this glorious Easter 
day purely prove a blessing to 
each of us as we worship together 
the risen Savior.

Sunday school at 10 a. m.
The Blanche Groves Y.W.A. 

will present an Easter program 
consisting of special music, read­
ings, and a short play, "First 
Easter,” directed by Mrs. Joe 
Goldston. Miss Anna Moores will 
direct the choir with Mrs. Allen 
Bryan at the piano.

Order of program—Doxology, 
prayer, hymns: “Hear Our Pray­
ers," "Awakening,” chorus. Scrip­
ture reading; hymn, “Fairest Lord 
Jesus.” The offeratory hymn, 
"Praise Ye The Lord.”

Sermon: “The Risen Lord," by 
the pastor.

Come and worship with us and 
help make this a great day.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
L. uuy Aaiaii, Par.ter 

While the Cross of Roman orig­
in was a means of shame to the 
one nailed there, but it has be­
come a reason of joy from a 
Christian view point. The Resur­
rection of Jesus rffcde it a source

DRESS-UP for

Shop our store for a New SUIT, 

DRESS, HAT, SHOES, COAT,
r v . - .  •

, BLOUSE, HOSIERY,

and all Accessories.

^  ‘  V '  *» * • J * '  *' i  % f

We are doing our utmost to keep a good assort­

ment of the best merchandise obtainable - - - for
4

men, women and children.

R E E N
DRY GOODS COMPANY

of joy after He rose from the dead. 
So we need to know the power of 
His resurrection in our life. Next 
Sunday is that glad day. We will 
have a Sun-Rise prayer meeting. 
The sun will rise about seven a.m. 
The service will he about one 
hour. All are invited to this Easter 
service.

Sunday school meets at 10 a. m. 
and you ought to meet for the 
study of the lesson. Bring some­
one with you.

Preaching service at 11 a. m., 
immediately following the Com­
munion worship. Evening service 
at 8:30 o'clock. We very cordially 
invite all to worship with us. The 
revival will close on Sunday eve­
ning.

It is the highest wish that every 
Christian will be greatly strength­
ened in fasting upon the truth of 
God's word. “Let the words of my 
mouth, and the meditation of my 
heart, be acceptable in thy sight, 
O Lord, my strength, and my re­
deemer.”

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to take this means of 

expressing our gratitude to our 
many friends for your sympathy 
and kindness in the passing of our 
loved one. May God's blessings be 
with you always.

Mr. and Mrs. Wiatt Heisler 
and Son.
J. B. Bourland and Children 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Keys 
and Family.

Mrs. J. H. Hum, who has bijen 
a patient at the Clarendon Clinic, 
was taken home last Saturday. 
Her daughter, Mrs. Van Zandt of 
Tulia has come to care for her 
while she'is convalescing.

Mrs. Clyde Bridges of Hedley, 
who has been a patient at the 
Clarendon Clinic, was taken home 
Friday in a Buntin ambulance.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Allen were 
Amprillo visitors Wednesday.

To Hold School 
In Mexico

AUSTIN—Part of the Univer­
sity of Texas faculty and student 
body will trek to Mexico this sum­
mer for a special six-weeks co­
operative extension field school, 
to be conducted by the Texans at 
the National University of Mex­
ico. The project will be financed 
by a $10,000 grant from the Co- 
Ordinator of Inter-American Af­
fairs.

Teh University of Texas staff 
members will make up the faculty 
of the field school together with 
ten faculty men from the Mexican 
University. Courses will be offer­
ed for both undergraduates and 
graduates from Texas and Mexico. 
Credit for work done will be 
granted by both schools.

The grant from the Coordinator 
of Inter-American Affairs will al­
so be used to finance a two-day 
conference on Latin-American 
culture, to be held at the Univer­
sity of Texas sometime in June.

WOOLEN FABRIC 
PRODUCTION

Production of woolen and wor­
sted woven fabrics in 1942 reach­
ed a new all-time high of 525,000 
000 linear yards. This is almost 50 
percent greater than in 1939. WPB 
has doubled wool quotas for es­
sential civilian fabrics which is 
expected to make an additional 
75,000,000 pounds of wool avail­
able for civilian needs. This is fur­
ther assurance that there will be 
adequate supplies of clothing for 
civilians during the fall and win­
ter of this year.

Mrs. Pete Long joined her hus­
band at Dallas and they returned 
to their home at Long Beach, Cali, 
after a visit here with her aunt, 
Mrs. W. H. Patrick and other rela­
tives.

Texas University 
Bays War Bonds

AUSTIN, April 20—The second 
War Loan drive got off to a good 
start here with the investment by 
the University of Texas of $1,828,- 
000 in United States 2^4% Treas­
ury bonds.

Thi» «nhscription for the Uni­
versity's Permanent or Endow­
ment fund brought to $6,181,300 
ihe amount of U. S. Treasury 
bonds bought by the University of 
Texas since Pearl Harbor. In ad­
dition, $679,478 has been invested 
in War Savings Bonds.

“The University is sending out 
thousands of its students to fight 
for a cause we hold dear, and we 
want our financial resources to 
help them,” President Homer P. 
Rainey commented. “We are con­
fident that other Texas groups 
and individuals will more than 
raise Texas' quota of $850,000,000. 
We can make it one billion dollars 
of Fighting Funds from Fighting 
Texans by the time of our state­
wide Texas Fights Rally here Sat­
urday, May 1st”

June Melton returned to Ama­
rillo Tuesday after a few days 
visit with her mother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Karl Adams.

J. R. Calhoun of San Antonio 
is in Clarendon on business mat­
ters. He was accompanied by Mr. 
Gilmore.

S/Sgt. Sheiby Bell, who is sta­
tioned at Frederick, Okla., is home 
on a 10-day furlough.

S. H. Lovell left Wednesday for 
Lubbock to make his home with 
his son, Earl Lovell.

Mrs. D. G. Lewtef returned 
home Wednesday from a week’s 
visit with her son Robert Lewter 
at Claude.

T

Mrs. J. T. Sykes and infant son 
were brought to the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Frank Har­
din, last Friday from Amarillo in 
a Buntin ambulance.

Mrs. J. A. Warren Jr. and Mrs. 
McMahan of Borger visited in the 
J. A. Warren home Friday even­
ing. While here they bought some 
baby chicks from the Clarendon 
Hatchery, as they are not avail­
able in Borger.

Mrs. Chester Talley was called 
to Amarillo Tuesday to be with 
her sister, Mrs. Frank Davis, who 
was to undergo an operation in a 
hospital there.

—

Henry Shoffitt, Lefors consta­
ble, was over Tuesday to make a 
short visit and return Mrs. Shof­
fitt, who has been here for some 
time with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Russell.

Mayor Tom Connqlly returned 
home Tuesday night from Waco. 
He attended the funeral of his 
sister, Mrs. T. G. Gaddy at Mc­
Gregor, Sunday. ,

Mrs. W. C. McDonald and dau­
ghters Myme and Janice of Plain- 
view arc visiting relatives and 
friends here the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. John Rhodes and 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Stewart and 
children visited Mrs. Rhode’s sis­
ter, Mr. and Mrs. Jack Perkins at 
McKnight Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Van Kennedy And 
children visited her sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Bass in Amarillo Sun.

Bill Todd who is stationed at 
Corpus Christi is home for a short 
visit. „

In  Our M arket
QUALITY MEATS

AT NO EXTRA COST
Try out Grain fsd Baby 
Baaf for your noxt moal— 
thars's a differsnea.

•  HOT BARBECUE
•  KRAFT CHEESE
•  LUNCH MEAT
•  Pur# Pork Sauiaga
•  FRESH OYSTERS

CLARENDON
FOOD STORE * ’

GROCERIES ft MARKET
^  ^  1  •  g  Parfoct Bakingoake-Kite Jo
COFFEE “  .35

LARD -5=-1,19
S Q U A S H

FRESH 

2 lbs. for

A P P L E S
Winasaps
DOZEN

30c
C A R R O T S

BUNCH

5c

P E A S
DELMONTE—Sirs 303 Can 13c
JELLY
Assort ad flavors—2 lb. J a r .......................... 35c
PEANUT BUTTER
Quart Jar 50c
SALMON
Pink 27c
TOMATO SOUP
CAMPBELLS—Can 10c
FRESH PRUNES
WHITE SWAN—No. 2Vt Can 25c
P E A R S
BRIMFULL—No. 2 Can 25c
GOOSEBERRIES
Haavy Syrup—No. 2 Can 29c

NICE FAT

F R Y E R S
ARMOURS

T R E A T
12 os. Can 
(5 Points)

CAN

39c
Plenty
Froah Bulk

Garden Seed
■ trf*

Pineapple
Juice

46 os. Can ■

39c
Grapefruit

Juice
46 os. Can

29c
• t • r _ » -

Ginger Bread 

M IX

WE DELIVER WE BUY CREAM. POULTRY. EGGS and HIDES PHONE__43
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LOST and  FOUND
FOUND — Womans kid glove. 

Owner please identify at Leader 
office and pay for tnis adv.

F O R  R E N T
FOR'SALE—One short horn Du’’ 

ham Bull, 3 yrs. old. One year* 
ling Durham Bull calf; one four 
year old horse and one horse 
eleven yrs. old. See Sam Tank- 
ersley. (8-c)

F O R  S A L E  .
FOR SALE—Macoupin Soy Bean 

Seed. Grown in this County and 
adapted to this part of the coun­
try. Excellent germination test. 
For sale by farmers of this 
county. See H. M. Breedlove, 
County Agent for location.

(11-p)

Mr. FARMER: — Increase the 
* stand and yield of grain sor­

ghum and .cotton by treating 
seed with NEW IMPROVED 
CERESAN.

Stocking's Drug Store 
_ _ _ __________________ (7-p)
Now you can buy TREATED 

GARDEN SEED to insure a bet­
ter, stand and a bigger yield. For 
sale at
. Stocking's Drug Store

(B-p)
FOR SALE—Have received car of 

Coal. D. O. Stallings. (8-2c)

FOR SALE—Georgia Hibred, first 
year cotton seed at $1.50 per 
bushel. See L̂ in Rundell. (8-2c)

SURPLUS STOCK OF BULBS— 
President canna (red), City of 
Portland (pink), 50c a dozen. 
About 40 varieties of Dahlias. 
Mrs. Lon Rundell. (8-3c)

FOR SALE—The best Tomato, 
Cabbage, Peppers and Egg 
plants in town. Hoy’s Green- 
nouse. Mrs. J. A. Warren. (10-p)

FOR SALE—1st year Hibred Cot­
ton seed. Call 932-F4 or see 
Frank Hardin. (9tfc)

FOR SALE — Five Burner Flor­
ence oil cook stove. Good con­
dition. See Leroy Ringwald at 
Farmers Exchange. (9-p)

1C. R. O. & deadly poison for 
RATS and MICE. Will not kill 
human beings, livestock, dogs, 
cats or poultry. Buy it safely at 

Stocking's Drug Store
(9-p)

FDR SALE — Practically new 
maple dining room suite. See 
Mrs. H. T. Warner. (9-p)

FOR SALE—Three Jersey cofvs. 
See H. W. Lovell at Ashtola.

' (9-p)
FOR SALE—A few coming 2 year 

old registered Hereford bulls. 
See Clyde Gilbert. (9-p)

Buy TREATED GARDEN SEED 
in the bulk at

Stocking's Drug Store
(7-p)

WORM CAPSULES — Guranteed 
to free your poultry flock from 
worms. $1.35 per hundred. 

Clarendon Hatchery
(36-tfc)

server and Disinfectant 
Thomas Mill and Faad Store

(29-tfc)

W A N T E D
WANTED— Empty feed 'sacks. 

Thomas Mill Sc Feed Store.
(Sltfc)

WANTED—Storage space to let. 
See J. L  Upton. (8tfc)

HELP W ANTED
Immediate opening; good 'Wat­
kins route in Clarendon. Car. 
experience unnecessary; , aver­
age earnings $?*» weekly; pay 
starts immediately. Largest 
company. West known products, 
biggest demand. Write J. R. 
Watkins Co., 70-90 W. Iowa 
Ave., Memphis, Tenn. (9-p)

WANTED— Will pay cash for 
good used wire clothes hangers. 
Unlimited quantity needed. 
Parsons Bros. (9-tfc)

WANTED—Unlimited quantity of 
Earth or (fish) worms. Will pay 
$1 per quart of solid worms. 
Bring to the Leader office. Bert 
Howell, Concessionaire, Lake 
McClellan. (9-tfc)

FREE! If Excess acid causes you 
pains of Stomach Ulcers, Indi­
gestion, Heartburn, Belching. 
Bloating, Nausea, Gas Pains, 
get free ̂ ample, Udga, at Stock­
ing's Drug Store. (19-pi

BULK SULPHUR— Five pounds 
for 25-cents.

Stocking's Drug Store
. (5-P)

AVENARIUS CARBOLINEUM
rids poultry of mites and blue 
bugs. Sold on a monly-back 
guarantee at—

Stocking's Drug Store
(52-p)

PURINA CARBOLINEUM—Kills 
chicken mites, ticks, blue bugs 
and fleas. $1.75 per gallon.

Clarendon Hatchery
(36-tfc)

FOR SALE—D-T Carbolated Cre- 
sote Base. ILIL and 
Mites, Fowl Ticks (Blue Bugs) 
and Repels Termites. Wood Pre-

If your first thought of a salad 
green is lettuce, and the market 
fails you, try kale, chard, beet 
tops, carrot tops, turnip greens, 
spinach, or cauliflower buds, sug­
gests the University of Texas 
home economics department. A 
tasty sauce can be made of may­
onnaise, chili sauce, cream and 
yellow cheese, and a touch of 
tabasco.

Muscular coordination between 
hands and eyes is one of the prime 
requisites of a good bombardier 
according to flight surgeon at 
Midland. Texas AAF Bombardier 
School.

Cadets at the world’s largest 
bombardier school, Midland, Tex­
as, carry pistols to protect the sec­
recy of the bombsight at all times 
they are using it.

The natural sugar in dried fruits 
keeps them from molding easily. 
Store them in a tight bag or jar in 
a cool place. Watch in wuu» 
weather for worms or weevils.

Farmers Must Do 
Double Feeding 
Job Now

Not only must they supply food 
for the United Nations’ fighting 
machine, but they must also sup­
ply food in the form of scrap for 
weapons of war.

In the first six months of 1943, 
3,000,000 tons of scrap metals are 
being sought from American 
farmers by the Salvage Division, 
WPB, aj the request of Chairman 
Donald M. Nelson. This means 
that every farm in the United 
States must collect and turn in an 
average of 1,000 pounds before 
July first.

Chairman Nelson has thus an­
nounced to the nation's farmers 
that there is still a critical need 
for an adequate backlog of scrap 
piles in communities throughout 
the country despite any rumors to 
thfe contrary.

Reports from many of the na­
tion’s steel producing centers in­
dicate that many mill inventories 
are dropping rapidly. Another 
crucial scrap shortage is expected 
despite the improvement in the 
over-all situation during the lat­
ter part of 1942. 1942 campaigns 
skimmed the cream of the farm 
and home scrap crop, but the 
farmers of the nation must dig 
much deeper in 1943 to assure ca­
pacity steel mill operation.

The American farmer, second 
only to industry as a source of 
heavy scrap, is being counted on 
for a large portion of this year’s 
scrap supplies. Every ton of farm 
scrap is needed in order to enable 
the war production program to 
meet the President's demand for 
more arms and equipment for the 
United Nations’ war machine.

The task o fcollecting scrap is 
far from finished. Until our fight­
ing forces are victorious it will be 
necessary to continue to support 
them with mountains of scrap.

Mrs. Lynn W. Morris, daughter 
of Mr. ar.d Mrs. W.-H. Patrick and 
who is Junior Technician at the 

• air buss at Lubbock, is
| visiting relatives in California.
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Buying Bonds Is Ours

We are still $134,800 short of our quota.

SHALL WE LET THESE BOYS DOWN OR SHALL WE DIG DOWN 

DEEP AND PUT THIS DRIVE OVER. THE GOOD PEOPLE OF DON­

LEY COUNTY HAVE NEVER FAILED YET—AND WON'T THIS TIMEI

W e're A ll In This Together - - - - - -
e

Let’s Pull Together For Victory. . .

DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

Rationing at a Glance
Ration Books

WAR RATION BOOK No. 1—Used for sugar, coffee and shoes.
WAR RATION BOOK No. 2—Blue stamps now being used for 

rationed processed foods. Red coupons being used for red meat, 
hard cheese, butter, margarine, shortening, edible oils and canned 
fish and meat Any “A" and “B” coupons not used this week are 
valid through April 30th.

* MILEAGE RATION BOOKS—Books A, B, and C used for 
passenger car gasoline; E and R books for non-highway uses; D 
for motorcycles; T for trucks and commercial vehicles.

Rationed Food CommoditlM
SUGAR—Stamp No. 12 in Book No. 1 good for 5 pounds until 

midnight May 31, 1943.
COFFEE—Stamp No. 26 in Book No. 1 (for those 14 or older on 

the date the book was issued) good for 1 pound until midnight 
April 25th.

SHOES—Stamp No. 17 in Book No. 1 good for 1 pair of shoes 
through June 15.

MEAT—Meat edible fats and oil, cheeses and canned fish 
rationed with red “A" stamps in War Ration Book 2 totalling 
16 points, valid March 29, expire April 30th.

April 4—Red “B” stamps become valid, Expire April 30. 
April 11—Red “C” stamps become valid, Expire April 30. 
April 18—Red “D” stamps become valid, Expire April 30. 
Mflrch 25—D. E. F. Blue stamps in War Ration Book 2 
become Valid. *»

Mileage Rationing
GASOLINE—Value of each coupon in A, B, and C books is 4 

gallons. Coupons No. 5 in A book are good until midnight May 21. 
Those who think they are eligible for supplemental rations should 
see their ljcal ration board.

TIRE INSPECTION—“A” book holders every 90 days; “B” 
book holders every 60 days; *’C” book holders every 45 days; 
“T” book holders every 60 days or every 5,000 miles, whichever 
occurs first.

TIRES—If official tire Inspector recommends a tire replace­
ment, apply to local ration board for tire ration certificate. Tires 
will be rationed to all on the basis of tire inspections and county 
quotas available with most essential mileage to come first. Recaps 
can now be secured without rationing certificates.

Other Rationing
Eligible purchasers needing new automobiles, bicycles, type­

writers, rubber foot-wear, and other commodities on which sales 
might be restricted should see their local ration board.

Seabees Average 
Higher Pay

Although official figures can’t 
be revealed, for obvious reasons, 
the actual number of men enlisted 
in the United States Navy’s con­
struction battalions — popularly 
known as the “Seabees”—now 
practically triples the figure of the 
whole peacetime Navy.

A short time ago. 160,000 “Sea­
bees” had been enlisted, and hun­
dreds of men with construction 
experience have volunteered their 
jervices since then.

The Dallas Navy recruiting dis­
trict has enlisted thousands. of 
men ofr this popular branch of the 
service since Pearl Harbor, and 
every day brings in new volun­
teers for the construction regi­
ments. According to Lieut.-Com- 
mander L. H. Ridout, Jr., officer 
in charge of the Dallas district, 
the back-log of Seabees is just 
about exhausted, and men who 
enlist now are being sent to train­
ing stations as fast as they are 
signed up and given ratings.

It has been pointed out that the 
phenomenal growth of the Sea- 
bees may be partly attributed to 
the fact that the proportion of 
rated men in this branch of the 
service — with correspondingly 
higher pay—far exceeds that of 
any branch of the Navy.

As an average, 60 per cent of a 
battalion's strength is made up of 
rated men. and 10 per ce.it of 
these are of chief petty officer 
grade. Age limits were placed be­
tween 17 and 50, to assure this un­
usual classification of personnel. 
The Seabees are truly a specialist 
outfit, and past engineering and 
construction experience of its per 
sonnei makes this so. The army 
engineering corps also offers op­
portunities.

Interviewing officer for the 
Navy’s civil engineering corps in 
this district is Lieut. C. B. Parrett, 
who is stationed in Dallas during 
♦he first three days of each week. 
During the last three days, Lieut. 
Parrett visits the various Navy 
recruiting stations in the Dallas 
district -to interview applicants 
and give information concerning 
ratings.

Miss Della Wood visited in 
Goodnight Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Williams 
spent Sunday until Wednesday in 
Amarillo visiting Chester Will­
iams and wife.

_________________PAGE FIVE

Grain Sorghums 
Recommended 
For West Texas

“Plainsmen, Martin and Cap- 
rock grain sorghums arc recom­
mended as satisfactory West Tex­
as varieties for combined use,” 
says Professor Frank R. Phillips, 
head of the Agricultural Depart­
ment at West Texas State College.

Experiments carried out by D. 
L. Jones, superintendent of the 
Lubbock Experiment Station, ov­
er a number of years indicate that 
these varieties meet West Texas 
demands, and i( is suggested that 
for best results they be planted 
the last of May or the first of 
June, because July plantings have 
not proved satisfactory at the 
Lubbock station in the past. Al­
though it is possible for them to 
mature in casual years when 
planted in July, such plantings are 
not considered safe.

Both Plainsmen and Caprock 
are selections from a cross—a dou­
ble dwarf kaffir and dwarf yellow 
milo made at the Lubbock station. 
Martin is a selection out of 
Wheatland, which in turn was a 
cross between kaffir and milo 
made at the Woodward Experi­
ment Station and -distributed in 
1931.

Martin has fewer leaves ‘and a 
more slender stalk and is said by 

-some to be resistant to lodging. 
The height of the plants are about 
the same—a little less than three 
feet. Martin matures in 103 to 107 
days; Plainsmen takes 106 to 120 
days, and Caprock matures in 124 
to 151 days.- The 1940 and 1941 
yields at the Lubbock Station 
were Martin 33 to 38; Plainsmen 
38 to 43, and Caprock 30 to 42.

Geo. Lane of Amarillo visited 
homefolks here Sunday.

Pfc. Weldon Warren 'of Fred­
erick, Okla. was home this week 
on a furlough, visiting homefullu 
and his wife, who is visiting here 
from Vernon..

J. A. Warren was a business 
visitor to Amarillo Monday.

far. and Mrs. K. T. Allred of
Clovis spent the week end visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert Bryan.

Miss Ruth Richerson 
Amarillo Sunday.

was in

Mrs. A. J. Morris came down 
from Amarillo Tuesday to be with 
Mrs. R. M. Morris who has been 
very ill but is much better at this 
time.

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Swift and 
daughter Anna Moores, and Miss 
Anna Moores visited in Memphis 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Shelton and 
daughter Edith, visited Mrs. E. Ivi. 
Ozier the week end.

Mrs. C. A. Burton is visiting 
her brother, Mr. Betts at Clovis 
this week.

Cleta Fern Phillips Is visiting 
relatives at Pampa this week.

Joyce Smith returned home 
Monday night from a visit with 
friends at Ft. Sumner, N. M.

,B ,# r ,Nc right *•
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ALL THREE
for ME!

Walton Tucker, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Tucker, is in the Fitz­
simmons hospital at Denver, Colo. 
He is reported some better.

To get the most nutritive value 
from vegetables, eat them raw, 
advises the University of Texas 
home economics department. All 
leafy vegetables, even beet tops 
and carrot tops, can be used in 
green salads, they point out.

Cabbage is a  good source of vit­
amin C—it can take the place of 
citrus fruit or tomatoes in your 
diet for this purpose, University 
of Texas home economics depart­
ment points out.

—On Pay Day. Buy Bonds—

2 GOOD FEED

i r i th jlr id e w T c h ic k s^ ’can grow on 
STARTENA!

3 GOOD SANITATION
Wlter which•ett a. a disinfectant, bowel astringent

f e ^ ’ Easy and economic^ to 
take needless chances «  

in your flock I
* * y  «>  c k o t -t -T m

CLARENDON HATCHERY
CLARENDON, TEXAS
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Burlington Offers 25,000 Acres For 
Use As Victory Gardens •

Free use of an estimated 25,000 
acres of arable land for the culti­
vation of Victory gardens war. of­
fered today to garden clubs, in­
dividuals and railroad employes 
by the Burlington Lines.

The lands are located along the  
Burlington rights of way in Illi­
nois, Iowa, Nebraska, Missouri, 
Kansas, Wisconsin, Colorado, Min­
nesota, Wyoming, Montana, South 
Dakota, N<;w Mexico and Texas, 
and are available without cost for 
the cultivation of food and certain 
other crops that will not interfere 
with railroad operations and safe­
ty.

President Ralph Budd of the 
Burlington Lines, who is a Trus­
tee of the National Victory Gar­
den Institute, said the develop­
ment of "Burlington Victory Gar­
den Clubs” at various points alo^ g 
the railroad will be encouraged, 
especially at division points and 
other locations where consider­
able numbers of Burlington em­
ployes are located.

All that is necessary to secure a 
right of way plot is to obtain an 
application blank from the near­
est Burlington agent. The Victory 
gardener may select his own plot 
and, provided it does not interfere 
with railroad operations and has 
not been allocated to someone 
else earlier, a perimt will be issu­
ed promptly. The only restriction 
on plantings is that the crops must 
not constitute a fire or safety haz­
ard and must not obstruct drain­
ages.

Garden permits for the cultiva­
tion of food crops on the Burling­
ton rights of way have been 
granted for many years, Mr. Budd 
said. During World War I the pub­
lic was permitted to plant gardens 
on suitable land along the right of 
way, and since that time many 
employes have continued to use 
railroad lands for gardening. In 
addition, the Burlington for the 
last 30 years has permitted farm­

ers to raise alfalfa on the right of 
way, whenever practicable, and 
probably has 3,000 or more acres 
of right of way planted in alfalfa 
at the present time.

State Historical 
Ass’nT o Meet 
April 22-24

AUSTIN, April 20— The men 
and women who have done more 
to collect and preserve both fact 
and iengcnd about Texas and 
Texans than any other single 
group in the state—the members 
of the Texas State Historical As­
sociation and the Texas Folk- Lore 
Society—will meet at the Univer­
sity of Texas in their first joint 
convention, April 22-24th.

This will mark the forty-sev- 
enthyear that the historians have 
come together, while it will be the 
twenty-ninth annual meeting for 
the folklorists.

Fact and fiction will be inter­
mingled at the three-day session, 
as tales of oil field romancers and 
frontier cowhands are interspers­
ed with reports on research into 
the history of the Mier Expedition 
and the early days of railroading 
in Texas.

The two organizations will hold 
individual sessions with the ex­
ception of a dinner meeting Fri­
day night, April 23. Speakers at 
that time will be Dr. Mody Boat- 
right, University of Texas pro­
fessor of English and president of 
the folklorists, ani  ̂ Gibb Gilchrist, 
dean of engineering at Texas 
A&M and representatives of the 
historians.

A smaller crowd than usual is 
expected for the meeting because 
of transportation restrictions. Dr. 
Bailey Carroll, acting director of 
Texas history research at the Uni­

A DOLLAR SAVED - - - 
IS A DOLLAR MADE
THEN W HY NOT SAVE BY BUYING THE BEST?

We aim to carry  a complete stock of the following 
Seed and Feed, and know you will be proud of 
buying same. For you can not buy b e tte r m er­
chandise than Texas S tate  Certified Seed, all 
kinds. Security Milk Feed for hogs, pigs and 
calves, and Chic-O-Linc mixed feeds, Chick S ta rt­
er, Gowirng Mash, Egg Mash and dairy feeds. Try 
any of the above and be convinced. None better 
at any price.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
PHONE 149

Be Ready
FOR

LET US HAVE

Your Clothes
Spick and Span

Send your clothes down to us as early  as possible 
so you can have them  cleaned and neatly  pressed, 
ready to wear Easter Sunday.

WE PICK-UP AND DELIVER

PARSONS BROS.
MASTER CLEANERS 

Phono 27

versity, has explained, but repre­
sentatives from, all sections of the 
state have signified their inten­
tion of coming. The customary 
meeting of Junior Historians— 
high school'members of the His­
torical Association—has been can­
celled to reduce travel.

4 4
4
4

GARDEN GLANCES 4
4

4 “America beautiful lies in the 4
4 hands of the gardeners.” 4
4 4
4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 * 4 4 4 4 4 4 4

Spring is again here in all its 
beauty and glamour. Many spring 
blossoms adorn the landscape. 
Spirea (bridle wreath) is the out­
standing of all the flowers that 
grace the yards of the city. Some 
of the ones to be of-part.icular in­
terest are the grounds of Kelly 
Chamberlain, Rev. G. T. Palmer, 
and the Misses Harned.

A very attractive display of 
tulips of many colors is presented 
in the garden of J. L. McMurtry. 
Mrs. Mollie E. Gray’s tulip garden 
is one of the prettiest spots in the 
city. Many people stop and marvel 
at this spot of beauty.

Have you noticed the corner in 
the yard of Sam Dyer? If you 
have not you are missing a treat. 
A small border plant of a bright 
rich pink forms an edge to add to 
the arrangement of vari-colored 
tulips.

Since victory gardens are a 
“must” this year, I think it proper 
to mention several that have a 
nice beginning in their vegetable 
plot. Included in this group are 
the gardens of Patching’s, Hum­
phrey’s, Weidman’s, and Allens- 
worth’s.

To keep berries, cherries, and 
grapes tiptop, store in a shallow 
tray in a cold place. Wash just be­
fore using.

West Texas District Falls Behind In 
Current WAAC Recruiting

The West Texas District has 
fallen deplorably behind, and at 
present is in danger of trailing all 
the rest of the state in the enroll­
ment of WAACs, it was declared 
this week by Lieut. Col. Marvin 
B. Durrette, commanding, West 
Texas Recruiting and Induction 
District, Lubbock.

“We cannot allow this blot on 
our record,” the Colonel said. "It 
is unreasonable to think that the 
women of West Texas are of a less 
patriotic character than the wom­
en of north, south and east Texas. 
We have a quota of 726 WAACs to 
meet by June 30th. Donley coun­
ty’s quota is 5. It is a fair quota, 
based on your urban population. 
We appeal to you to meet it, to 
double it if possible.”

The War Department is unable 
to meet current requests of capi- 
pus and posts for WAAC units due 
to failure to meet recruiting quo­
tas assigned for the first quarter 
of the year, he pointed out. "The 
WAAC is included in the overall 
strength of the army now, and it 
is absolutely necessary that its ex­
pansion keep pace with the over­
all training program.” “We have it 
straight from Lieut. General Bre- 
hon Somervell that women can do 
many non-combatant jobs just as 
well as, and some better than, 
many men who are urgently need­
ed and eminently qualified for 
combat duty. Every eligible wom­
an who is not otherwise engaged 
in work that is essential to win­
ning the war belongs in the wom­
en’s army. We are counting on 
Donley county to do its part.”

To be eligible for the WAAC, a 
woman must be between the ages 
of 21 and 44, have at least two 
years of high school education.

and be able to pass the mental 
and physical examinatoins. Wom­
en interested in joining the WA­
AC are invited to call or write the 
recruiting station in Pampa, or to 
write direct to the West Texas Re­
cruiting and Induction Headquar­
ters in Lubbock.

4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 > 4  4

H U D G I N S
Mis. S. M Harp

Miss Mollie Dee Stonecipher 
spent Saturday night and Sunday 
with her brother Cleo Stonecipher 
and wife.

Bill Perdue visited until bed 
time Thursday night with Sidney 
Harp.

Mr. and Mrs. Lacy Noble and 
son of Clarendon called on Mr. 
and Mrs. S. M. Harp and son Sun­
day afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. L. O. Christie and 
Nelson of Martin, Margaret and 
Laura Ann Fowlkes of Naylor 
and Mr. and Mrs. S. M. Harp visit­
ed with Mr. and Mrs. O. L. Jacobs 
Thursday.

There was not very many out 
for Sunday school and preaching 
Sunday. Bro. Fitzgerald preached 
Sunday night. We have changed 
our Sunday school to began at 11 
o’clock. We hope all will be out 
to help next'Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnh Perdue and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. S. M. 
Harp and son took Sunday dinner 
with Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Perdue 
and son of Hedley.

Mrs. L. O. Christie of Martin 
and Mrs. V. H. Christie called on 
Mrs. S. M. Harp and Mrs. O. L. 
Jacobs Tuesday of last week.

Bill Perdue returned home from 
a two weeks stay at Lubbock last 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Awfill spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. J. L. 
Talley.

Mr. and Mrs Jack Whitt took 
Sunday dinner with Mr. and Mrs. 
O. L. Jacobs and Mr. and Mrs. 
Lacy Noble and son called in the 
afternoon.

Charslie Ann Whitt visited with 
Joyce West Sunday.

Mrs. O. L. Jacobs visited with 
Mrs. V. H. Christie awhile Friday 
afternoon.

4 4 4 * 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4 4
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H. E. Johnson spent Saturday 
night with Joe Adams.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Roberson and 
family visited in the H. C. Smith 
home Friday eve.

Mrs. Ray Heath has been visit­
ing her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Brock and family. She has been 
living in California. She is now 
staying with Mrs. Joe Dilli who 
had her tonsils removed a few 
days ago.

The young folks Sunday school 
class enjoyed an ice cream supper 
at the school house Friday night.

We are sorry to report that Mrs. 
William Pierce underwent a ma­
jor operation at the Clarendon
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Clinic Saturday morning. We wish 
for her a speedy recovery.

Jewell Pierce spent Sunday nite 
with her cousin Thelma Pierce.

Evelyn Jones spent Friday nite 
with Gladys Mae Johnson.

Ina May Brock spent Saturday 
night with Juanita Mooring.

Mrs. Roy Brock and daughter 
Lorene, Mrs. Edd Mooring and 
daughter Juanita and Mrs. Buck 
Parker spent Sunday evening 
with Mr. and Mrs. Collier Brock 
and family.

Mrs. Tounson, Mrs. Leonard 
Dozier and daughter visited in the 
Roy Roberson home Sunday, eve­
ning.

Mrs. Jesse Vick is staying with 
Mrs. Lloyd Risley.

Betty Lou Naylor spent Monday 
evening with Irene Vick.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerrel Patterson 
had the misfortune to have a 
brooder house, two hundred baby 
chiexs and a hay stack to bum 
Sunday night.

ONION AND POTATO 
MAXI MU MS RAISED

Maximum prices on dry onions 
and white potatoes of the late 
1942 crop for sales during May 
and June, 1943, will be 10 cents 
higher than in April, the OPA has 
announced. The change in price is 
designed to spread available sup­
plies evenly over the next three 
months.

TNI BONLIT COUNTY LIAOIt. $100 Ml TUI.

ABSTRACTS •  LOANS 
and REAL ESTA TE

Donley County A bstract Company 
C. E. KILLOUGH 

Phone 44

T he “ come and get It”  call never comes too early fo r 
hungry  soldiers at the end o f a day’s m arch. It’s a 
welcome call fo r pipeliners, too, as they wind up  
their day’s work of patroling gas transm ission lines.

Im portant as a means of cutting down on transporta* 
tion, these m aintenance crews usually m ake two-week 
journeys— pitch cam p to eat, and sleep where the 
day’s work leaves them .

By keeping thousands of miles of high-pressure gas 
lines throughout the Gulf South in tip-top shape, these 
crews are perform ing  a vital war-time service. For 
on the efficiency o f these huge steel arteries greatly 
depends the ou tpu t o f war m ateriel. And nothing 
m ust in terfere  with the production o f ships, guns, 
tanks, and planes that means success o r failu re  to 
o u r heroic defenders o f freedom .

NATURAL GAS AND OIL ARE ESSENTIAL TO VICTORY . * ,  VICTORY IS OUR No. 1 JO B.

\

UN/TED GAS P/PE LINE COMPANY
A N D  A  I  I O C I A T E D . C O M P A N I E I

B U Y  W A R  B O N D S  . . . F O R  V I C T O R Y  N O W  . . . F O R  P E A C E  I N T H E  F U T U R E
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Letter Describes Peaceful Native 
Village Before Bombers Came
EDITORS NOTE—The following
letter was sent in by C. E. Griggs 
of Dumas, former citizen of Clar. 
endon, giving a vivid description 
of a peaceful native village, before 
and during an air raid, as two ser­
vice men saw it. The location of 
the village is not given.

Dumas, Texas 
April 9, 1943 

Donley County Leader, 
Clarendon, Texas.

Had another letter a few days 
ago from the boys, Joe Young and 
Clifford Callaway, some where

way out back and down under, 
(South Sea Islands I think).

They gave us the description of 
the place where they are located, 
and I will pass it on to you as best 
I can.

This place is located on the 
banks of a river with clear water, 
and on wash days the native wo­
men gather to do their laundry on 
the rocks as theh water flows past. 
In place of a Maytag washer, they 
use a rock and the old type bat­
tling stick.

The clear face of the moon lay 
spattered on the water, but its 
light was far away—swift summer 
rain clouds were on the horizon 
visible only when sheets of light­
ning exploded soundlessly behind 
them. Such a night to be remem­
bered b yall. Wild flowers grew 
in profusion to the water’s edge.

Just below the village and to 
the right, stood a coconut grove 
planted in straight rows; behind 
this the jungle came close, while 
in the tree tops, lives wild mon­
keys, parrots, and all other kinds 
of birds that live in the tropics.

Beyond this, (Mime animals 
range, while back in the moun­
tains one can find the larger ani­
mals.

From over the wind swept 
mountains the parting of the gol­
den sun cast a burned colored hue 
over the beautiful valley. All this 
made an everlasting impression 
on our minds as we stood there by 
the crumbling walls of the cen­
tury old church.

Lazy smoke poured out of the 
adobe ovens. It was supper time.

There was no need to hurry as 
this meal was no different than 
others for centuries back. Out at 
the edge of the jungle, groups of 
native children were gathering 
sticks of dry wood from among 
the green bushes.

The stately old mission over­
looked the narrow streets and 
crude houses—the homes of the 
devout. The ancient dim lighted 
church was host at sunset of in­
dividual Indians (or natives) com­
ing in for a moment of prayer. We 
lingered by this old mission, for 
ages it seemed to me, for we were 
trying to picture it centuries ago, 
trying to get the old walls to tell 
us something of its dying past.

Children and dogs played at our 
feet. The thought of it all brought 
tears to our eyes. This was no 
dream, for we were standing a- 
midst real people whose customs 
had not changed for centuries.

Standing by the old wall of this 
mission at sunset, seeing the sky 
with gorgeous colors change from 
hue to hue, then to twilight blue, 
is one way to absorb the beauties 
of nature and the fascination of 
the ancient ways of life.

This was before the war came, 
but now all has changed.

And then the air raid sounded.
The streets are very narrow, on 

either side the houses were honey­

combed in the sunlight. Church 
after church was blasted into a 
heap of crumbling ruin.

As the people had gathered in 
one church, and Mass was in pro­
gress, then came one of the worst 
raids. Neither the pritest nor the 
worshippers faltered in their de­
votion, although the blast of 
bursting bombs swayed them 
where they knelt.

Many have lost all they possess­
ed. Families who have men folk 
have gone to the army. We were 
taken vertically downward by 
narrow circular steps for 60 ft. in­
to the pitch darkness in one of 
these caves.

It was a lull between raids, and 
most of the occupants had snatch­
ed this opportunity to collect their 
ration of bread. With our guide 
we groped our way toward a glim­
mer of light where a girl stood in 
the door way. By the glow of a lit­
tle lamp made out of a pepper tin 
with a cotton wick she showed us 
her home and its equipment, one 
chair, an alcove in the rock for 
cooking stove, a box with some 
utensils. Eight people lived in this 
room, and contained all they pos­
sessed. A small girl in her teens 
offered to lend us her lamp to ex­
plore the tunnel. Smiling bravely, 
she said she was used to sitting in 
the dark and did not mind it. The 
tunnel, one of scores was about 
one half mile long.

Out side drying clothes flapped 
in the wind, and canaries sing in 
cages against the rocks.

We asked one woman what she 
did all day when she was not 
cooking or washing. "Me,” she 
said, “I sing all de day.” During 
the raids the people pray, not for 
themselves, but for the men at the 
guns, the pilots of the spitfires, 
the crew of the convoys battling 
to reach them.

The blast of the bombs sweeps 
through the shelter. Women lay 
wet handkerchiefs over their bab­
ies faces so they may breathe. Be­
tween raids children play in the 
streets, they play at, or near the 
shelters, in the doorways of the 
homes that remain, and among 
the ruins of them that do not.

The unofficial signal stations 
are manned by little boys. When 
the red flag goes up, every body 
except the little boys take to shel­
ter. • They stay by their posts. 
Finding two crouching beside 
their mast during a raid, we urged

A FEED for EVERY NEED
Whan you need any kind of food for stock or poultry bo 
suro to Ins poet our stock, for wo guarantee it to bo good.

Custom Grinding
Wo aro equipped to do your grinding any way you want 
it dona. Profit more by grinding.

Thomas Mill & Feed Store
iHmuuiuituimiiiiiiiiiitmiiiuiiUi:iiiuiiuii!Himiiiiiiuiuiiuuiuuiuui<a>MiiiuuuiMUUituuuii

Planting Seed
COTTON—Half and Half culled and re-cleaned.

QUADRON MAIZE  and KAFFIR

Bring your own sacks.

Registered Duroc Hog Farm
One Milo North of Ashtola. Texas

A father is fighting... 
So his boy may tinker

with

C le c  t r i e  i t  if
\

Over 160 of our men (and one 
woman) are in the U. S. armed forces. 
Last week one of these men, a good 
electrician who had been with the 
company for many years and who is a 
veteran of World W ar I, came home 
on leave. (He’s a volunteer in the 
Navy.)

W ith him when he dropped around 
to say “hello” and talk shop with the 
fellows was his 13-year-old s o n .. .  
wearing his Boy Scout uniform.

All the guys were darn glad to see 
him and know he has a sweil Navy 
rating as an electrical technician. 
Naturally they asked a lot of ques­
tions and learned that Uncle Sam’s 
Navy thinks mighty high of its men 
who come from America’s electrical 
companies where they got their train­
ing and experience. They learned, 
too, that electric power is behind 
most of the Navy’s great punch . . .

building ships, guns, bombs, to r­
pedoes and the like with which to 
win the victory.

F inally  someone asked: “ W ell, 
Don, have you decided—just what 
are YOU fighting for?” He answered 
right off. pointing to his son.

“ Me— I ’m fighting for th is kid. 
He’s a Boy Scout, see, and it teaches 
’em to be independent and self-reli­
ant. Well, dictators and bureaucrats 
don’t like that—they want regimen­
tation. So I'm  fighting so he—and 
millions like him—will be free.

“Too, the kid’s kinda like me. He 
has a knack for tinkering with elec­
tricity . . .  likes it, see! Well, the kid 
may not be another Edison. But I 
want him to have the same opportun­
ities that Edison had—and a lot of 
o ther guys who helped make th is 
country great.

“I want him to be free to tinker all 
he likes. And if anything comes of it, 
if his tinkering  creates something 
useful to the world, like Edison’s 
tinkering, I want him to share in the 
profits.”

Out of this freedom of individual 
opportunity grew Am erica's great 
industries that today are pouring out 
the weapons of w a r. . .  as in peace­
time they pour out the comforts and 
conveniences of everyday home life 
to give us the highest of all standards 
of living.

This freedom is worth fighting 
for. Free men and women, working 
out their own destinies w ith their 
own hands and minds . . .  building, 
inventing, im proving . . .  taking the 
risks and enjoying the rewards. And 
be tte ring  the world as they better 
themselves!

INVEST IN AMERICA— J » y  War Bonds and Stamps

West Texas Utilities 
Company

them to take shelter, but they re­
fused, scornfully.

“It is for the community we 
stay here”, explained the smaller 
of the two.

That night we went down a 
steep stairway between ruined 
houses to visit a shelter. The shel­
ter was a tunnel that descended 
to unknown depth. Tiers of bunks 
ranged along the walls. Forty or 
fifty children lay around the altar 
on the bare steps. A gir! of about 
12 appeared out of the shadow and 
facing the altar began to sing. The 
motionless adults sat listening. 
The child prayed on, her jet black 
eyes was the only part of her that 
moved. Two girls unrolled a 
blanket beside us and lay down to 
sleep. A tiny girl of about three 
suddenly set off alone up a high 
ladder to the third tier of bunks, 
reached it unaided, and curled up 
like a tired kitten to sleep. The 
children's voices stopped. There 
was a shuffling of little bodies on 
the hard cold stone and the clear­
ing of throats. Then out side in 
the moonlight, as they finished, 
the all-clear sounded.

These two boys say, ‘‘Such is 
life near the front lines.”

Yours truly,
C. E. Griggs

CAFE CEILINGS 
IM M INENT

District OPA offices have been 
granted the authority to fix ceil­
ing prices for food and beverages 
served by restaurants, cafeterias, 
hotels and other eating and drink 
ing establishments. The base per­
iod for such establishments is 
April 4-10 and each firm must 
fi e its menu or price list with lo­
cal War Price and Rationing 
Boards by May 1.
MM—W IIM illM W — ■II1IIWM—II1I1IIIWIIII11IIIIW— i

Dr. Keith S. Lowell
GENERAL PRACTICE 

AND SURGERY

Offices in Goldston Bldg. 
Office Phone 126 

Residence Phone 174
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Men Wanted For 
Beach Patrol

Lubbock, April 20—Men within 
the draft age desiring to enter the 
Coast Guard Reserve for service 
in the Mounted Beach Patrol, or 
as Radio Technicians, were urged 
today, by Yeoman First Class 
Mathes, to contact the Coast 
Guard Office at the Post Office 
Building in Lubbock.

Men volunteering for the Mouni 
ted Beach Patrol must be thor­
oughly familiar with the care and 
management of horses, it was 
stated. No waivers for physical 
defects will be made*and only the 
applications of men who can pass 
a Coast Guard Class G physical 
examination will be accepted.

Yeoman Mathes said a quota of 
100 men for the Beach Patrol and

25 Radio Technicians has been set 
for the month of April. After con­
tacting the Coast Guard Office in 
Lubbock, and being found quali­
fied, men desiring these specialist 
branches will be inducted into the 
Coast Guard as apprentice sea­
men. Instructions as to subsequent 
ratings and place of assignment 
will be issued by the United Stat­
es Coast Guard in New Orleans, 
Louisiana. Applicants must pre­
sent three letters of recommenda­
tion as to riding experience.

Store to save. Find out how 
each feted keeps best, and store 
each article in the right, and cor­
rectly cared for, cupboard, cooler, 
can, or jar.

Cover fresh meat loosely. Wipe 
with damp cloth just before cook­
ing. If ground, store in extra cool 
place and cook soon.

a

F I S H I N G

SEASON
OPENS MAY 1st at

Lake McCllelan
MOTOR AND ROW BOATS FOR RENT

PLENTY BAIT OF ALL KINDS

and P len ty  of everything that you will 
need for a good fishing trip.

Bag limits on all fish increased over previous seasons.

iiiin

Tractor Fuel
Get the most out of your trac to r and the fuel it burns by 
coming to us for your complete supply. We have every­
thing you need and each item is of the highest Quality.

Your Battery Needs Regular Attention!
»

Now that you're driving less, it can die a sad deathl When a ba tte ry  stands 
idle it runs down - - loses power and dies! The car owner who w ants to keep 
on the road checks battery  strength, w ithout waiting until an em ergency 
reveals a dead battery . We are equipped to check your ba tte ry—and when 
it weakens, to supply you with a new one tha t will give your car the power 
it needsl If it merely runs down, we have the best re-charging equipm ent 
to build it up again.

PREPARE NOW FOR

SUMMER DRIVING
Bring your auto in today for a first class Wash and Lubrication Job. Let us 
drain youratra»sm ission and differential and put in the proper lubricant for 
w arm  w eather driving and save the w ear and tear on the precious gears by 
use of old w inter lubricants.

When you need a new tire, see us before you buy.

D A V I S
BUMPER TO BUMPER SERVICE

DALE HILL. Manager



PAGE EIGHT.. .THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

OPA Meeting to be 
Held a t Pampa 
May 13th

— Donley County War Price Rnd 
Rationing Board today announced 
that on Thursday, May 13, repre­
sentatives of the Dallas Regional 
and Lubbock District Offices of 
the Office of Price Administration 
will be in Pampa to conduct meet­
ings with the Price Panels and 
Price Clerks of the War Price and 
Rationing Boards of Roberts, 
Gray, Wheeler, and Donley Coun­
ties ■■ nd with representatives of 
the wholesale and retail grocery

« trade in these counties.
The meeting with Price Panels 

and Price Clerks will be held at 
2:00 p. m. in Pampa. The purpose 
of this meeting is to acquaint the 
members of the various boards 
wii1'  the new functions of Price 
Panels and with the new simpli­
fied Price Regulations.

In the past, merchants through­
out the country have had to con­
tact the nearest branch of the Of­
fice of Price Administration in 
order to secure copies of regula­
tions and to have- these regula­
tions explained. In line with thi­
ne w policy of delegating certain 
functions to Price Panels through­
out the country, the members of 
the Price Panels will be handed 
certain regulations as a start to­
ward the completion of the gener­
al plan. These regulations will be 
explained and discussed in detail, 
so that in the future the Price 
Panels will be in a position to as­

sist the merchants to a better un­
derstanding of the regulations, 
thus eliminating the necessity of 
contacting the nearest branch of
the OPA on every prpblem which 
might arise. As the Price Panels 
become familiar with their npw 
duties they will be handed addi­
tional regulations with the end in 
view that they will eventually be 
in a position to solve most of the 
problems locally, thus eliminating 
to a great extent the delay and 
sometimes confuison resulting 
from the necessity of contacting 
the nearest OPA office.

The meeting with representa­
tives of the wholesale -nd retail 
food trade will be held at 8:30 
p. m. in Pampa* The importance of 
this meeting cannot be too greatly 
stressed. New simplified food reg­
ulations will be gone into in de­
tail and everyone engaged in the 
wholesale and retail food business 
is urged to attend and to bring 
their individual problems to the 
attention of those conducting the 
meeting. This meeting is not in­
tended -s a general meeting 
where the regulations are merely 
explained, but is intended also to 
bring out the vurious problems 
with which the merchants are 
confronted and to solve them.

It is understood that Mr. How­
ard R. Gholson, District Director 
of the Lubbock District Office, 
will be there, with Mr. Clarence 
W. Nichols. Regional Price Execu­
tive of the Dallas Regional Office, 
Mr. J. B. Mooney, District Price 
Officer, and Mr. H. T. Gehring 
and Mr. W. A. Robertson, District 
Price Specialists.

This meeting in Pampa is one of

Tubes Repaired
If you have an Inner tuba that la split or torn in- 

two, bring it to ua and wa can rapalr it.

Tire Repairs
Wa can rapalr Tractor or Auto Tires of all kinds

%
and sisas. Wa have the right type of equipment to 

repair them and give your tires a much longer life.

0. K. Rubber Welder
BUSTER DILLARD, Owner

■ID

W A R M
WEATHER

CALLS FOR A

C H A N G E
e

LET US MARFAK YOUR CAR

Yes, warm  w eather calls for a change from  w inter 
lubricants to a sum m er weight throughout.
Bring your car in and let us give it a good wash job 
and change the oils and greases in the transm iss­
ion, differential and crank case. A change now 
m ay save you a lot of money and will give you 
m any more trouble-free miles of driving.

WE USE THE BEST

T e x a c o  P r o d u c t s

Frank Hommel I
TEXACO SERVICE STATION

TEXACO PRODUCTS— WHOLESALE A RETAIL 
Phono 2S6-J

a series aimed at contacting all 
the War Price and Rationing 
Boards throughout the Lubbock 
District of the OPA, as well as 
representatives of the wholesale 
and retail food trade in the whole 
area.

Mrs. B. L. Jenkins 
Passes Away

Funeral services will be held 
Friday afternoon at 3 o’clock at 
the Methodist church for Mrs. 
B. L. Jenkins, who passed away in 
a Dallas hospital Sunday morning 
following a short illness. Rev. 
J. O. Quattlebaum J r , assisted by 
Rev. E. L. Moody, will officiate.

Mrs. Jenkins, wife of Dr. B. L. 
Jenkins, has been a resident of 
Donley county for a long number 
of years. She was prominent 
among social and civic organiza­
tions, always willing to do what 
she could for the betterment of 
her home town. She will always 
be remembered by her many 
friends who loved her.

Her body will arrive from Dal­
las Friday morning and will lie in 
state at the family home from 
10:30 a. m. until 2:30 p. m.

Pallbearers will be S. W. Lowe, 
John Blocker, Fred Buntin, J. T. 
Patman, W. T. Link, Mack Bour- 
land, Fred Chamberlain and C. E. 
Killough.

She is survived by her husband 
and two sons, B. L. Jenkins Jr. of 
Amarillo and Dr. Oscar L. Jenkins
of Dallas.

Burial will be in Citizens Ceme­
tery under the direction of the 
Buntin Funeral Home.

N ew  P r ic e  S u p p o r t  
P r o g r a m  A n n o u n c e d

Producers of vital war crops in 
Texas will receive higher price 
supports under this year’s Food 
for Freedom program, according 
to the State USDA War Board.

Warcrops on which increased 
price supports have been an­
nounced by the War Food Ad­
ministration are dry beans, dry 
peas, peanuts, soybeans and flax­
seed while incentive payments 
will be made on Irish potatoes and 
designated truck crops for the 
fresh market.

For dry edible beans, the sup­
port price ranges from $6.50 per 
hundred pounds to $7.50 per hun­
dred pounds, depending on the 
class and variety.

To encourage harvesting of an 
increased quantity of blackeye 
peas, the Department will pur­
chase peas at a level of $5.75 per 
hundred pounds of cleaned and 
bagged U. S. Grade No. 1, deliver­
ed to points designated By county 
AAA committees. The price for 
U. S. No. 2 will be $5.60 per hund­
red pounds while the price for 
U. S. No. 3, will be $5.35 per hund­
red pounds.

Pioneer Cowboy 
Buried Here

Funeral services were held here 
Wednesday afternoon for Charles 
F. Heisler at the First Baptist 
church with Rev. E. L. Moody of­
ficiating and assisted by Rev. 
Marvin Menafee.

Mr. Heisler. aged 83, will be re­
memberer! as an old time cow- 
puncher who came to the Pan­
handle in 1881 and punched cattle 
for the JA ranch for over 23 years. 
For the past few years he has 
been residing with his son Wiatt 
Heisler at Wayside. His wife pre­
ceded him in death and was bur­
ied here in 1933.

He is survived by one son, Wiatt 
Heisler of Wayside and three 
grandchildren, Billie Wiatt Heis­
ler, Charles and Mary Kate Bour- 
land of Pampa.

Pallbearers were Eddie Mahler, 
Chester Burnett, Edgar Patching, 
A. L. Stevens, Roy McMurtry and 
Don Grady.

Burial was fn Citizens Cemetery 
with funeral arrangements under 
the direction of Buntin Funeral 
Home.

VISIT AT SAN ANGELO
Mrs. J. W. Smithey left Sunday 

morning for San Angelo to visit 
her son, Mr. and Mrs. Paul Smith­
ey and family. She accompanied 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Speed who went 
down to see their son, Homer 
Charles, receive his bombardier 
wings at the San Angelo Bombar­
dier School.

VISIT IN LUBBOCK
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Whitlock, 

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Whitlock 
and son Larry Tom and Mr. and 
Mrs. Willard Skelton visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarence Whitlock and 
Price Whitlock at Lubbock, Sua

CERTIFICATES OF WAR 
NECESSITY HOT 
TRANSFERABLE

Certificates of War Necessity 
and “T” ration gasoline coupons 
are not to bo transferred along 
with titles to trucks, the Texas 
USDA War Board has been advis­
ed by ODT.

ODT pointed out that violation 
of this regulation may result in 
suspension or revocation of Cer­
tificates.

When transfers are completed, 
the new operators should file ap­
plications for Certificates of War 
Necessity. Failure to file the ap­
plication also may result in sus­
pension of Certificates, the ODT 
said.

DR. JENKINS WRITES 
APPRECIATION
Dear Friends:

You can never know what your 
hundreds of letters, cards and 
telegrams have meant to me while 
a patient in Harris Memorial Me­
thodist Hospital at Fort Worth, 
Texas.

Especially those since the pass­
ing of the loved one who has been 
so dear and meant so much to me 
for more than fifty years.

Words could never express my 
appreciation if my strength would 
permit me to write each of you. 
So I can now only say. may God's 
richest benediction ever abide 
with and sustain you through 
your life’s activities.

Your Friend,
B. L. Jenkins.

-Thursday, April 22. 1943

Mrs. S. H. Lovell 
Buried Sat.

Funeral services were held Sat­
urday morning, April 17 for Mrs. 
S. H. Lovell at the Methodist 
church with Rev. J. O. Quattle­
baum Jr„ officiating.

Mrs. Lovell, aged 72, passed 
away at her home here Friday 
morning after a lengthy illness. 
She had been a resident of this 
county for the past 29 years. She 
was loved an<| cheerished by all 
those who had the pleasure of her 
acquaintance.

Survivors besides her husband 
include one son, Earl Lovell of 
Lubbock and a daughter, Mrs. 
Clark Russell of McKinney.

Pallbearers were R. C. Bell, 
Nathan Cox, Harve Smith, Ray­
burn Smith, W. O. Butler, and 
A. W. Simpson.

Interment was in Citizens ceme­
tery with funeral arrangements 
under the direction of the Buntin 
Funeral Home.

Among Amarillo's visitors here 
Sunday were Dave Johnson, A. C. 
Donnell, Stanley Carlile and fam­
ily and Dick Lanham.

POINT VALUES 
LOWERED

Because some perishable meat 
products were moving very slowly 
OPA reduced by one or two points 
the ration values of sausage (in­
cluding Weiners, bologna, pork 
sausuge), scrapple, chitterlings, 
and pork neck and backbones'.

Dock Williams who has been 
located in Arizona for the past 
several months, came in Thurs­
day for a visit with homefolks. He 
states his health is some better, 
and he intends to return ther4 af­
ter his visit for that purpose.

Army Engineer 
Corps Opened 
To Volunteers

The Corps of Engineers Spec­
ialists Recruitment Program, an­
nounced by Col R. R. Neyiand, 
Southwestern Division Engineer, 
provides for qualified civilians be­
tween the ages of 18 and 38, and 
therefore subject to induction 
through Selective Service, to vol­
unteer in advance of their induc­
tion orders for the Corps of En­
gineers. Provision is also made for 
civilians in the age bracket be­
tween 38 and 50, inclusive, who 
are not subject to the draft at this 
time, to voluntarily enlist for the 
Corps of Engineers.

Construction men, electricians, 
enginemen, utility repairmen, 
tractor and truck drivers, welders, 
machine operators, radio opera­
tors and repairmen, mechanics, 
powdermen, riggers, shipping 
clerks, railroad men, and a host of 
other skills are required.

Under this plan trained civilian 
operators prior to their induction 
by the Selective Service Board 
may volunteer. The nearest Afea 
Engineer, Engineers stationed at 
various projects, and District En­
gineers at Tulsa, Okla.. Denison, 
Texas, and Little Rock, Ark., will 
take the application, pass on their 
qualifications, and if acceptable, 
will provide the volunteer with o 
letter which he will submit to hi? 
local Selective Service Board. 
This letter will earmark him for 
the Engineers with the Army Air 
Forces, Army Ground Forces, or 
Army Service Forces.

Last Rites Held 
For R. W. Talley

Funeral services were held Fri­
day afternoon at the Methodist 
church for Robert Wilson Talley 
with Rev. J. O. Quattlebaum Jr., 
officiating.

Mr. Talley, aged 85 years, pass­
ed away at the home of his daugh­
ter, Mrs. Chas. Cole at Altus, 
Okla. last Thursday. Ke had been 
a resident of Clarendon for a 
number of years.

He is survived by five daugh­
ters. Mb Chas. Cole, Mrs. Anna 
Guillr.f of Memphis, Miss Crickett 
Talley of Louisville, Ky.; Mrs. 
Nora McMurtry and Mrs. Guy 
Kerbow of Pampa.

Interment was in Citizens ceme­
tery with funeral arrangements 
under the direction of the King 
Funeral Home of Memphis.

CEILING PRICE ON 
CORN RAISED

A ceiling price on corn five 
cents per bushel higher than pres­
ent maximums, established April 
14, will be effective until Septem­
ber 30, 1943. According to OPA, 
which acted upon instructions 
from Stabilization Director Byrn­
es and Food Administrator Davis, 
there will be no further increases 
in corn prices during the 1943 
market season. The price raise is 
designed to relieve the present 
acute market shortage of com for 
livestock feeding and industrial 
processing.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Heatherly of 
Hobbs, N. M. visited the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Heath­
erly.

FOB YOUR CONVENIENCE, WE HAVE GROCERY COUPON BOOKS IN ALL DENOMINATIONS FOR SALE.

LETTUCE head 6 c APPLES iok. 1 8 c

CARROTS bunch 3 c ORANGES
JUICY

doz. 2 5 c
SPINACH * 10c
NEW POTATOES lb g 4 C

RAISIN BRAN
SKINNERS

TEA

b°x H e

LEMONS
CALIFORNIA

doz.

GRAPEFRUIT 6 for
TEXAS

DRIED PRUNES 2Ibs.

White Swan
V* lb. B o x ....................... 27c TOMATOES only 8c"  ■ W H ■ W  " (ls  polnt, ) _ No# 2 Can W U

Pure Cane Sugar !b
No. 12 Stamp

DEXTROSE
CORN SUGAR (No Points)

lb box 2 0 c
Easter Egg Colors box J Q q  Pure LARD 4 lb Curt, g y  q 
Laundry Soap 5bars 2 1 C  MOTHERS OATS box 2 5 c

No. 28 Stamp oxpirM Saturday, April 25th. SUNNY BOY

COFFEE ADMIRATION * 32c i FLOUR „2f £  5100 *1“
TENDER BEEF ROAST B A
(8 Points)—Pound ............................  & 9 C

FRESH LIVER
(5 Points)—P ound.....................................     I w C

FANCY BREAKFAST BACON ” J A
(8 Points)—P ound ..................................................................." § £ C

GROUND H EA T  “ A f
(S Points)—Pound ......................................................... dtawC

TO FEED ONE OF THE BEST - - - FEED YUKON'S 
BEST FEEDS------LAYING MASH and GROWING MASH
CORN FLAKES ✓  '
3 B oxas........ .................................«. . .

LUNCHEON MEAT
Pound ..........................

Easterjjams7^M .ft 43c . S i b  41c
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT THE AMOUNT OF ANY ITEMS.

M - SYSTEM


