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CHRISTMAS GIFTS  OVERSEAS 
MUST BE MAILED IN SEPTEMBER

' ‘Save strong string and box 
material and start to plan shop­
ping,” Postmaster General Frank 
C. Walker advises Americans in 
announcing the rules for mailing 
of Christmas gifts for Army and 
Navy personnel overseas.

This year the Christmas mail­
ing period for both Army and 
Navy overseas forces is the same 
—September 15 to October 15. Af­
ter October 15 no gift parcel may 
be mailed to a soldier without the 
presentation of a written request 
from him.

The great demands upon ship­
ping and the need for giving pref­
erence to arms, munitions, medi­
cine and food is the prime reason 
for the early mailing date. More­
over, gift parcels must travel 
great distances to reach Army and 
Navy personnel who are located 
at remote points, and frequently 
the transfer of large numbers to 
new station! necessitates forward­
ing of the packages and additional 
time is required.

‘The response that our people 
made last year during the over­
seas mailing period demonstrated 
that they will cooperate in any 
measure designed for the welfare 
of our armed forces personnel,” 
Mr. Walker said. “It is not easy to 
concentrate on Christmas gifts in 
the midst of warm weather here 
at home but our people recognized 
the need, and because they want 
the men and women who are ab­
sent from their homes to know 
that they are not forgotten at 
Christmas they took pains to as­
sure prompt delivery of Christ­
mas gifts.

“I know that our people will 
observe the overseas mailing sche­
dule once more this year but I do 
wish to stress this fact;. More

ROBERT LAND GRADUATED 
FROM NAVAL SCHOOL

Duty orders to sea or to some 
shore station now await Blue­
jacket Robert C. Land, 37, hus­
band of Julia M. Land, Clarendon, 
a recent graduate of the Naval 
Training School for storekeepers 
at the Toledo, Ohio, Naval Arm­
ory.
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“It is not a pleasant thing to 
visit a postal concentration center 
and see the numbers of Christmas 
parcels which will never reach 
servicemen and servicewomen. 
Post office personnel have orders 
to do everything they can to effect 
delivery of such gifts, because we 
know how important they are for 
the happiness of the armed forces. 
Too frequently, nothing can be 
done.

"I am sorry that anyone ever 
mentioned that the size of a shoe 
box is the approximate limit for 
packages intended for gift mail­
ings overseas. Unhappily many 
people became convinced that a 
shoe box is the best possible con­
tainer. We must be mindful that 
these gifts must travel far, with 
shipping space crowded. If the 
gifts are to be protected in transit 
they must be packed in boxes 
made of metal, wood, solid fiber- 
board, or strong double-faced cor- 
ragated fiberboard, reinforced 
with strong gummed paper tape or 
tied with strong twine. If both 
tape and strong twine are used, so 
much the better. If the outer 
wrapper is crushed—and this is 
likely to happen—the loss of con­
tents may be prevented if fiber- 
board boxes are wrapped in heavy 
paper.

“We were unable to deliver 
many parcels which families and 
friends sent to men and women 
overseas last year because they 
were crushed in transit and the 
gift and the outside wrapper be­
came separated. We would have 
been able to make delivery if the 
address had been shown on the 
inside wrapper. We advise that 
everyone write the address of the 
sender and addressee inside the 
package as well as outside.

“Christmas gift* mean much to 
our people overseas. Because 
strong twine, heavy paper and 
boxes and fiberboard will prove of 
real help In making delivery of 
gifts possible I urge those at home 
to begin saving these materials 
now. As time goes on they are go­
ing to become even more scarce 
than they are now.”

J. 0 . Thompson 
Passes Away

Funeral services will be held 
this afternoon at 6 p. m. at the 
Methodist Church for J. O 
Thompson, with Rev. G. T. Pal­
mer officiating, assisted by Rev. 
D. M. Fitzgerald.

Mr. Thompson passed away at 
his home four miles east of town 
Wednesday.

J. O. Thompson was bom in 
North Carolina March 27, 1862,
and came to Texas with his par­
ents in 1872 settling in Dallas 
County. He attended college at 
Georgetown University, then 
came to West Texas and served 6 
years as engineer in an engineer­
ing Corps. He went back to Kauf­
man County, where he was engag­
ed in business and had farming in­
terests for a number of years. He 
moved with his family to Donley 
County in 1916 and since that time 
has resided on his farm four miles 
east of town. He was a long time 
member of the Methodist church, 
which he loved.

Surviving Mr Thompson are his 
widow, Mrs. Mattie Knox Thomp­
son, whom he married in 1894; 
two daughters, Mrs. H. A. De 
Lamar of Dumas, Mrs. W. K.

m
ipson

Mo.,''J. O. Thompson Jr.v'of New 
York City, Judge Thompson of 
Dumas. Doc Thompson and Joe 
Thompson of Clarendon; five 
grandchildren, Henry DeLamar 
Jr. of Dumas, Mrs. Dan Smith of 
Shreveport, La., Betty Ann Craft 
of Dumas, Joan Thompson of 
Clarendon and Billie Thompson of 
Los Angeles; one great grand­
child, Sharon DeLamar of Dumas; 
two brothers, P. C. Thompson of 
Kaufman, E. E. Thompson of Los 
Angeles, and two sisters, Mrs. J. 
W. Park of Kaufman and Mrs. T. 
B. Yeates of Austin.

Pallbearers will be M. G. Cot- 
tingham, Horton Leathers, Sim­
mons Powell, Sam Roberts, 
Heckel Stark and Joe Johnson.

Burial will be in Citizens Ceme­
tery with Buntin Funeral Home 
in charge of arrangements.

Infantile Paralysis 
Chairman Here 
Last Week

Mrs. George H. Pittman, State 
Chairman of National Foundation 
for Infantile Paralysis, was in 
Clarendon last week discussing 
plans of the Foundation with Mrs. 
Johnnie Blocker, local Chairman. 
Although the financial drive is 
conducted only once each year, 
work of this group goes on con­
tinually. Mrs. Pittman brought a 
workable plan to be followed in 
case of an epidemic in Donley 
County and explained that the 
State group stands ready to back 
up any local group needing help.

“Infantile paralysis", said Mrs. 
Pittman, “is a thing which, so far, 
we have been unable to control. 
However, once it strikes, we must 
be organized to go into immediate 
action, not only for the sake of 
the victim but to endeavor to pre 
vent the spread of the disease.” 
The State Chairman highly com­
plimented the work of burses and 
doctors throughout Texas, and 
was especially grateful to Mr 
John Q. Public, who by his offer­
ing of time arid money, makes it 
possible for children throughout 
the nation to have the opportunity 
to overcome the effects of the 
dreaded polio.

RATIONING 
AT A GLANCE

By PEPPY BLOCKER

Mr. and Mrs. V- L. Spencer and 
family who have been living at 
Okmulgee, Okla. have moved 
back to Clarendon.

Roy Stocking Dies 
At Plainview

Roy Stocking, 62 years old, 
Plainview pharmacist and former 
Hereford business man, died sud­
denly of heart disease at his home 
in Plainview Saturday. He was 
apparently in perfect health up to 
the moment of his death.

Mr. Stocking, son of a pioneer 
Panhandle physician, the late Dr. 
J. D. Stocking of Clarendon, 
came to Plainview 18 years ago 
from Hereford, where he engaged 
in the drug and automobile busi­
ness for 11 years. Prior to that 
time he was a pharmacist at Clar­
endon. He was born at Lawrence 
and moved with his parents to 
Clarendon in 1885. He was mar­
ried in 1907 at Dallas to Elise 
Coulter, who is among survivors. 
He was employed as a pharmacist 
at the Plainview Drug Store.

Other survivors are a daughter, 
Mrs. H. E. Gipson, Lubbock; a son 
J. T. Stocking of Amarillo; a 
brother, Dr. F. F. Stocking, Milica, 
Minn.: six half brothers and sis­
ters, J. D. Stocking, Dr. G. W. 
Stocking, Mrs. Joe R. Burton, Col- 
lis Stocking, Mrs. W. L. McConnell 
and Hobart E. Stocking.
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THE FOOD OUTLOOK
Let’s look at the food outlook 

through the eyes of the Bureau of 
.Agricultural Economics of the

received by the A&M College Ex­
tension Service says that civilian 
supplies .of all the principal foods 
will, at least, be as large as they 
were last summer. The total 
quantity of meats available to 
civilians in the July-September 
period is expected to be less than 
in the past few months but above 
last summer’s supply. Meat con­
sumption in the third quarter of 
the year usually is less than in the 
April-June quarter.

Poultry marketings probably 
will set a new record for this time 
of year, and only slightly smaller 
quantities of butter arc expected 
to be available for civilians in 
July and August than in May and 
June.

The BAE estimates that the 
fresh market truck crop acreage 
may yield a fifth more vegetables 
this season than in 1943. The sur­
vey adds that the nation’s all-time 
high wheat crop, estimated con­
servatively at 1,035-million bush­
els, indicates that somewhat larg­
er quantities of wheat than was 
expected earlier may be used for 
feed. Texas contributed record 
yield of more than 72-million 
bushels to the nation’s history­
making production.

Meanwhile the Office of Price 
Administration has a word of cau­
tion and explanation on the dis­
tribution of these unequalled 
crops. It warns that it may be­
come necessary again to assign 
point values to the meats and pro­
cessed foods which were put on 
the free list last May. Canned 
vegetables, OPA assures, will be 
returned to point rationing. The 
chief reason for making the point 
free temporarily was to help move 
the 1944-45 stocks so as to induce 
canners to provide a maximum of 
1944-45 pack.

Regardless of big food crops, 
OPA calls for the cooperation of 
every consumer against waste. 
“In wartime,” it says, “waste and 
spoilage is a national scandal.”

Sugar Stamp 33 in War Ration 
Book IV will become good for five 
pounds of sugar on September 1st. 
Second allotments of canning 
sugar are now available—when 
you go to the local office to make 
application for this sugar, be sure 
to take the small slip of paper 
(given you when you received 
your first allotment coupons) and 
also your War Ration Book IV. 
Sugar stamps 30, 31, and 32 are 
each good indefinitely for five 
pounds, in case you’ve not already 
used these stamps. Also stamp 40 
is good for five pounds ot sugar 
for home canning.

Application blanks for Gasoline 
“A” books are available at all fill­
ing stations throughout Donley 
County. Motorists should secure 
these blanks, fill in and return by 
mail to the local board, together 
with the outside cover of the old 
"A" book. All applications should 
be in by September 15th and new 
books will be mailed to the own­
ers by September 22nd. Please DO 
NOT apply in person at the local 
office but MAIL your applica­
tions. Do not forget to attach the 
outside cover of your old book.

A8 through F5, blue stamps in 
War Ration Book Four, are good 
indefinitely for ten points each for 
processed food*.

A8 through Z8 and A5 through 
C5, red stamps are good indefi­
nitely for ten points each for 
meats and fats.

A12 coupons are good through 
September 1st for gasoline.

Annual Meeting 
Donley County
N.F.L.A.

The annual neeting of the Don­
ley County National Farm Loan 
Association will be held at the Na­
tional Farm Loan Association Of­
fice in Clarendon, on Wednesday, 
September 13, at 2:30 p. m„ an­
nounced Secretary-Treas., Ray­
burn L. Smith following a meet­
ing of the association's board of 
directors today.

“There is considerable interest 
aomng the stockholders in this 
meeting,” Mr. Smith said, “be­
cause, as landowners, they are in­
terested in maintaining a strong, 
home-owned association for long 
term credit service."

The association, which recently 
paid a five percent dividend on 
stock, has a total of $1,087,900.00 
in loans outstanding in this terri­
tory; has a capital stock of $39,- 
985.00, all owned by its members, 
and has reserves and surplus of 
$20,929.49.

Directors of the association are:
C. H. Bugbee, J. B. Masterson, 

C. B. Morris, Alva T. Simmons, 
R. W. Moore.
Rayburn L. Smith is Secretary- 

Treasurer of the Donley County 
N. F. L. A.

Old Settlers to Meet 
Friday With Picnic
INFANT DAUGHTER OF 
MR. AND MRS. GEO. HALL 
BURIED WEDNESDAY

Funeral services were held 
Wednesday afternoon at 6 p. m. at 
the Assembly of God Church for 
Vernetta Carole Hall with Rev. 
J. J. Grubbs of McLean in.charge.

Vernetta, age 1 month and 11 
days, was the infant daughttgr of 
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. W. Hall of Clar­
endon. He is serving with the U. S. 
Navy.

Surviving besides the parents 
are two brothers, Joe W. and Mar­
vin R. Hall of Clarendou; Grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hall of 
Clarendon and Mr. Fred Rodgers 
of Frezno, Calif.

Burial was in Citizens Cemetery 
with Womack Funeral Home in 
charge of arrangements.

Three are each gaod 
for one pair of shoes.

indefinitely

Use your tokens first! If you use 
them properly, you should never 
have more than nine tokens of 
each color.

Take care of your ration books! 
Book IV must last a long time. 
Handle it carefully. Keep Book III 
in a safe place and use it when 
buying rationed shoes. If you 
should lose a book, notify your lo­
cal board at once; if you should 
find someone else's book, drop it 
in the post office and it will be 
delivered to the owner.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerome Stocking 
are taking their vacation in New 
Mexico. Mrs. Ruby Bromley has 
charge of their drug store during 
their absence,

NAT WOODS SHOWING 
IMPROVEMENT

Returning home the first of the 
week, Cleo Woods reported that 
his father, Nat Woods of Ft. 
Worth, was showing improvement 
after a continued illness of many 
complications over a period of 
months.

Husband of Local 
Woman Missing 
In France

Mrs. May Skinner received 
word from the War Department 
Monday August 14th stating that 
her husband S/Sgt. Lloyd J. Skin* 
ner was missing in action in 
France as of July 27th. He was in 
the Infantry, 2nd Division.

He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
A. L. Skinner of Hanna, Okla., 
and before entering the service 
was a farmer.

Mrs. Skinner is staying with her 
mother, Mrs. N. A. Sims here in 
Clarendon.

MRS. WATT OF GILES 
SERIOUSLY ILL

The legion of friends of the 
family will regret to learn of the 
critical illness of Mrs. E. H. Watt.

Mr. and Mrs. Watt have resided 
in Donley county for more than 
fifty years and number their 
friends by the extent of their 
acquaintance.

Mrs. Watt is a sister of Mrs. W. 
I. Rains and Mrs. E. W. Bromley.

Jarvis Brock 
Killed In Action

Word was received from the 
War Department Tuesday by Mr. 
and Mrs. C. H. Brock who reside 
in the Goldston community, that 
their son Jarvis had been killed in 
action in the Southwest Pacific.

Jarvij was reported as a casual­
ty in the invasion of Suipan about 
July 10th„ but little particulars

tie for that islar

CHRISTMAS MAILING  
FOR OVERSEAS

September 15 to October 15 has 
been named “Christmas Mailing 
Month” by the Army and Navy, 
which this year have 33,000 uni­
formed men and women in their 
postal services to handle an esti­
mated 70 million Christmas pres­
ents—three times as many as last 
year, the Office of War Informa­
tion says. Packages mailed during 
“Christmas Mailing M o n t h ” 
should reach their destination by 
Christmas Day. Packages should 
weigh no more than five pounds 
and have combined length, width 
and depth of not more than 36 
inches.

Former Resident 
Buried Here

Mrs. S. E. Teague, 86, pioneer of 
the Panhandle and a former resi­
dent of Clarendon, died last 
Thursday morning in the home of 
her daughter, Mrs. Oressa Mc- 
Caslin in Boise, Idaho, with whom 
she had resided for the past sev­
eral years.

Bom in Mississippi, April 15, 
1858, the family homesteaded near 
Plainview, Texas in 1891 and re­
sided there until their removal to 
Clarendon in 1905. Her husband 
the late E. A. Teague died here in 
May, 1923.

Mrs. Teague had been ip failing 
health, due to advanced age, sev-

l L * - q . | ---------  , ----------

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Estlack 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Lowe 
and family at Wellington over the 
week end.

Miss Charlotte Molesworth and 
her father, John Molesworth, have 
returned from Wellington where 
Mr. Molesworth was in the hos­
pital quite ill.

daughters, Mrs. Claire Teague 
Doak of Lubbock, Mrs. E. C. 
Ramey of Lubbock and Mrs. Mc-
Coslin, all of whom were at their 
mother's bedside at the time of 
death; four sons, J. M. Teague of 
Brownfield, W. O. Teague of Los 
Angeles, F. E. Teague of Lubbock 
and V. R. Teague of Sacramento, 
Calif.; 25 grandchildren and a 
number of great grandchildren. 
Only one brother of her immed­
iate family survives, L. M. Lyles 
of Lovington, N. M.

Funeral services were held 
Monday afternoon at the Buntin 
Funeral Chapel with Rev. G. T. 
Palmer officiating and assisted by 
Rev. H. W. Hanks.

Burial was beside her husband 
in Citizens Cemetery.

Pallbearers were Eldon Franks, 
Walter Clifford, Fred Chamber- 
lain, Joe Goldston, Paul Shelton 
and C. C. Powell.

The fourteenth annual gather­
ing of the Donley County Old Set­
tlers Association will be held at 
Tate Park northeast of Hedley 
Friday, according to a statement 
of Uncle Bill Rains here Wednes­
day.

The boys and girls of Donley 
county do not want, and do not 
expect the home folks to “fold up” 
merely because of the war. They 
want them to carry on in the 
usual manner, and they will. **

The gathering this year will 
have no set program. Rather will 
it be a time of getting together in 
good old neighborly fashion that 
such a mingling of old friends will 
bring to the saddened renewed 
hopes and consolation.

There will be boys in the ser­
vice who will read about this 
gathering this Friday. They will 
recall their having been to such 
gatherings in past years. They 
will be encouraged to think that 
the folks back home carry on in 
the usual manner, and join all of 
us in the hopes that they will all 
be back here for the annual sess­
ion next year.

Walter DeBord is president of 
the Association, and Mrs. Mable 
Bridges is the secretary.

To be eligible to membership, 
one must have lived within the 
county twenty years. Many have 
lived in old Donley county over 
fifty years.

Prepare your picnic basket and 
meet your friends at the old 
stomping grounds at least by ten 
o’clock Friday morning, August 
18th. Many happy days have been 
spent there, and the spirit that 
will prevail will depend upon 
your presence.

There will be plenty of coffee,
— 4 *« » —>*■■■■.
your own clip.

OPA CHANGES 
POINT VALUES

No more ration points for utility 
grades of beef and lamb will be 
required through September 2, 
and for the same period point- 
values have been restored on pork 
loins, pork hams and canned fish, 
the Office of Price Administration 
has announced. Cheeses were in­
creased from two to four points a 
pound and farm or country butter 
from eight to 12 points a pound.

Dr. J. Gordon Stewart spent the 
week end at Abbott, Texas in the 
home of his wife’s parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Easterling where Mrs. 
Stewart and small son Larry Gor­
don had visited for a week. They 
returned home Sunday .

Mr. and Mrs. Houston Miller of 
Canadian were in Clarendon Mon 
day attending to business.

Funeral Services 
For Mrs. Hubert 
Johnson

Funeral services were held Fri­
day afternoon at the Methodist 
church for Mrs. Martha Lou John­
son with Rev. H. W. Hanks, of­
ficiating.

Mrs. Johnson passed away Aug­
ust 10th. She had been a resident 
of Donley county for the past 24 
years.

Surviving are her husband, 
Hubert Johnson, one daughter, 
Gladys Mae, three sons, Jerry 
Fred of the U. S. Navy, Hubert 
and Roy of Clarendon. Her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. C. M. Pelton, 
Wichita Falls, two sisters Lena 
Lee of Odessa and Anna Lee Doil 
of Demming, N. M.

Pallbearers were Olin Bain, 
Bill Johnson, Jake Longan, Win­
field Mosley, Ed Mooring, Joe 
Mathews.

Burial was in Citizens Cemetery 
with Womack Funeral Home in 
charge of arrangements.

SHAMBURGER LBR. CO.
HAS NEW MANAGER

Oscar Thomas, who for some­
time has been employed as book­
keeper for the Foxworth-Gal- 
braith Lumber Co. here, has been 
made manager of the local Sham- 
burger Lumber Co. yard, and as­
sumed his duties as such August 
15th. Mr. Hyett, who has been in 
temporary charge of this yard 
since Bill Weatherly, former man­
ager was inducted into the Arm­
ed forces, returned to his home in 
Wichita Falls. It is understood 
that Leroy Butler has accepted 
the position vacated by Mr. 
Thomas.

* Clarendon Clinic \ 

J Hospital Notes *

Medical:
Mrs. F. L. Behrens, Clarendon; 

Mrs. Dorothy Rodgers, Pampa. 
Surgical:

Frances, Jessie and Robert Hill. 
Births:

Mr. and Mrs. W. J. David, a girL

Ration Reminder
MEATS, FATS—Red stamps A8 

through Z8 and A5 through D5, 
good indefinitely.

PROCESSED FOODS — Blue 
stamps A8 through Z8 and A5 
through V5, good indefinitely.

SUGAR—Sugar stamps 30, 31 
and 32, each good for five pounds 
indefinitely, and 33 good for five 
pounds after September 1st and 
remains good indefinitely. Sugar 
stamp 40, good for five pounds of 
canning sugar through February, 
next year.

GASOLINE—A-12 coupons are 
good through September 21st.

SHOES—Airplane stamps 1 and 
2, good indefinitely.

Good Rain Puts 
Bumper Crops 
In Sight

Farmers and ranchers were on 
the jubilant side today after the 
most welcome rains were received 
over the entire count}* Tuesday 
and Wednesday nights. From all 
reports, the rain was general all 
over the entire Panhandle and ex­
tended up through the middle 
western states. Taking in such a 
wide scope, it is not likely to get 
anywhere near as hot as the past 
three weeks and crop prospects 
point to a bumper crop for most 
parts of the county. Some feed 
crops were beginning to need rain 
and the cotton was wilting in 
spots, but this rain more or less 
assures the crops as far as mois­
ture is concerned.

The official weather station at 
the Airport reported .33 Tuesday 
night and .81 Wednesday night. 
Weather forecasts report more 
moisture in prospect for the en­
tire section. Those enjoying elec­
trical displays, had a chance to get 
their eyes full both nights.
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+ LIBRARY NOTES *
♦  By Mrs. C. A  Burton •  
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

Gov. James Cox. who was the 
running mate of Franklin D. 
Roosevelt in 1920. has completed 
his autobiography, and it is now 
in the hands of Simon St Schuster.

Dr. Frank Kingdon. author of 
“That Man in the Whitehouse," 
has revised the book so that the 
new edition will contain the re­
cent conventions.

“Invasion” is the title of the 
eye-witness history of the thirty 
days that shook Hitler's world— 
from June 6 to July 5, 1944—by 
Charles Christian Wertenbaker, to 
be published in September. Wer­
tenbaker, head of “Time-Life’s” 
staff of foreign correspondents, 
has been in France with General 
Omar Bradley, and has just re­
turned to London to complete the 
manuscript of “Invasion”—which 
will condense and interpret hund­
reds of dispatches, stories of hero­
ism and eyewitness accounts into 
a clear, dramatic history of what 
really happened—before, during 
and after the invasion of France.

W th Disney is making a film in 
German, the first since the war 
started. It is the first Disney pic­
ture since “Snow White" of six 
years ago to have a German nar­
ration.

Boyce House has a new book 
being published by the Naylor 
Company of San Antonio. It is 
•Tall Talk From Texas.” It is said 
to be entirely different from his 
1  Give You Texas” which sold 
60.000 copies in ten editions this 
year, yet is equally as humorous 
—and is typically Texas. It is said 
that one eastern publisher and 
another Texas publisher turned 
down "I Give You Texas”—but 
Naylor Co. found their faith in it 
justified.

Dr. George W. Truett left his 
theological library to the South­
western Baptist Theological Semi­
nary at Ft. Worth. It is estimated 
to contain 3600 volumes. Dr. El­
liott, librarian at the Seminary, 
says the collection shows the 
widely ranging mind of Dr. Truett 
—it is not confined to the narrow 
channels of religious thinking, but 
includes social, moral and eco­
nomic implications of theology.

John O’Donnell, the anti-Roose­

velt writer, is at Roosevelt Hos­
pital in Washington.

The George Bernard Shaw 
birthday edition of the Saturday 
Review of Literature will be pre­
sented to Shaw in London by 
Katherine Cornell.

Pearl Buck's novel, “Dragon 
Seed,” was given a premiere in 
New York recently, attended by 
the Chinese Ambassador and his 
wife and Pearl Buck—and was for 
the benefit of East and West As­
sociation of which Pearl Buck is 
president

Congressman Joseph Clark 
Baldwin’s book, “This Is Where I 
Came In”, is scheduled for Octo­
ber publication by Coward-Mc- 
Cann—and is said to be a glamor­
ous, star-spangled account of the 
people and worlds the author has 
known. Beneath the light-hearted 
anecdotes runs a serious commen­
tary upon government and world 
affairs by a man who has first­
hand knowledge of them.

UNITED GAS EMPLOYEES 
PASS $1,000,000 MARK 
IN BOND BUYING

Total purchases of war bonds by 
employees of the United Gas Pipe 
Line Company and its two affili­
ate companies, the United Oil Pipe 
Line Company and the Union Pro­
ducing Company, have passed the 
$1,000,000 mark, according to in­
formation released this week by 
the payroll department of the 
companies.

Figures released by the compa­
nies do not include ‘‘personar’ 
bond purchases made through 
agencies other than the payroll 
deduction system, the report 
pointed out.

As of July 31, total purchases 
through the payroll deduction 
plap had reached $1,040,914.75, 
since inauguration of the plan on 
February 1, 1942. Of this amount, 
the 2,047 employes of United Gas 
Pipe Line Company accounted for 
$796,918.72; Union Producing 
Company’s 424. for $228,024.38; 
and United Oil Pipe Line Com­
pany, with 38 employes, for $15,- 
971.75.

Mrs. Clyde Butler and son 
Leroy were Amarillo shoppers 
Thursday.

«•

- PARENTS -
Before you make plain to tend your children to College 
or before you decide they cam not go at all this year, why 
not investigate the possibilities of sending them to 
Clarendon Junior College?

YOU CAN GIVE THEM TWO YEARS OF FULLY ACCREDITED COLLEGE WORK 

THAT WILL B iTT IR  PREPARE THEM FOR A UNIVERSITY AT THE LOWEST 

POSSIBLE COST.

TH EY  C A N  R ID E THE COLLEGE B U S  A N D  ST A Y  AT HOME. SA V IN G  
BO A R D  A N D  ROOM. TH E G R EA TEST E X P E N SE . OR THERE W ILL BE  
O P E N IN G S FO R  TH O SE W HO W A N T TO W ORK For THEIR ROOM  
A N D  BO ARD.

CLARENDON JUNIOR COLLEGE
OPENS SEPT. 4, 1944

MEMBER OF TEXAS ASSOCIATION OP COLLEGES 

CREDITS ACCEPTED IN ALL SENIOR COLLEGES

THE COLLEGE BUS WILL RUN FROM MEMPHIS TO CLARENDON JUNIOR COL­

LEGE AND RETURN DAILY AND IF SUFFICIENT INTEREST IS MANIFESTED 

OTHER ROUTES WILL BE ESTABLISHED.

G ot la  touch w ith  D oan R. E. D ronnan at one# and lat h im  ex p la in  tha m any  

advaatagaa and  the lo w  coot o f E ducation  at C larendon Junior C ollege.

Meeting Called 
To Rewrite Texas 
Pension Laws
The Honorable C. W. Moore 
State Representative 
LeLeon, Texas 
Dear Mr. Moore:

As Chairman of House Commit­
tee under and by virtue of H.S.R. 
No. 159, and subsequent amend­
ments, I hereby convene said 
House Committee for public hear­
ings in Dallas, Dallas County, 
Texas, at 10 a. m., in the District 
Courtroom, on the 11th day of 
September, A. D., 1944.

The purpose of this meeting is 
to rewrite the Texas Pension 
Laws, and to prepare a bill pro­
viding for a standard budget for 
all old people, in lieu of the edicts 
now issued by the Department of 
Public Welfare, and to prepare a 
Bill fixing jurisdiction of Appeals 
from the findings of the local in 
vestigators to some State Depart 
ment other than the Department 
of Public Welfare, and to prepare 
a bill regulating Homes where old 
people are boarded on agreement 
of endorsing their monthly pen­
sion check over to the operator of 
the Home.

As Secretary of this Committee, 
I trust you will notify the mem­
bers of the same and all members 
of the House and the Senate, and 
all State Officials who might be 
interested, and all Welfare Or­
ganizations in and near Dallas, 
advising them that we will welt 
come their suggestions and pres­
ence at said meeting. It will also 
be advisable, perhaps to take up 
any other matters of interest that 
might be called to this Commit­
tee’s attention during said meet­
ing.

Yours very truly,
Ennis Favors,
State Representative

Cost of The State 
Govt, of Texas

Cost of the state government of 
Texas rose from $10.11 per capita 
in 1924 to a peak of $32.07 in
1942, then receded to $28.31 in
1943, the Texas Mid-Continent Oil 
and Gas Association pointed out 
today after compiling reports of 
the State Comptroller and the 
State Auditor covering ■ twenty
year period.

“In 1924 the cost of the state 
government was $50,919,819 con­
trasted with the all-time high of 
$205,741,882 set in 1942 and with 
$181,795,949 in 1943,” the Acssoci- 
ation pointed out 

“The drop in 1943 was the first 
decline in nine years. In 1935 the 
cost of the state government was

LAST TIMES FRIDAY—ANNE BAXTER IN UTHE NORTH STAR"

SATURDAY ONLY

ROY ROGERS

‘THE SONG OF TEXAS”
plus

Color Cartoon and Sports Roo)

P A S T IM E
SAT. FREV. — SU N . A M ON.

With Stan 
ef 9 Oraet

PR ESEN TS

I0R0THY LAMOUR 
FRED MacMURRAY 

BETTY HUTTON
— DIANA LYNN

MM CHANDIER
RAYMOND WAIIURN

EDDIE F0Y, Jr.
D t r B y  GEORGE MARSHAL! Scree* Hey by

Plus 
P a t h *  M

TUESDAY ONLY

ANNA STEN

"THREE RUSSIAN GIRLS
Plus

Color Cartoon 
and Community Sing

WED.— THURS.— FRIDAY

-G-MPs s tr a n g e  d ra m a  
of a  

CAPTIVE 
SWEETHEART!

Movlatono K
...... I |  P

$111,001,060 compared with $113,- 
711,619 in 1934.

“The revenue from taxes in 
1943 was $149,969,853 contrasted 
with $151,136,009 in 1942. Income 
from all other sources such as 
fees, royalties and federal aid 
amounted to $95,581,588 in 1943

CONSTRUCTION
HELPERS

NEEDED AT ONCE

— for—

L  0. Stocker Co.
SEMINOLE or BORGER, TEXAS

CONSTRUCTING 100-OCTANE AVIATION GASOLINE * 
PLANT FOR PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY

Transportation furnished sn ro u ts  to  job. Top w ages—  
lon g  tlm s job—N ow  w ork ing  60 hours a w eek — T im e  
and one-half after 40 hours.

LIVING QUARTERS AVAILABLE

Sae Company Repraaentatlve at War Manpower Commission

U. S. EMPLOYMENT SERVICE 
O F F I C E

— at—

DONLEY COUNTY COURT HOUSE 

frea S until 5 o’clock

SATURDAY AFTERNOON, AUGUST 1 M

compared with $77,933,070 in 1942.
“The total revenue to the state 

in 1943, $245,551,441, exceeded the 
cost of government by $63,755,490. 
The surplus in 1942 was $23,327,- 
197.

“In the twenty-year period from 
1924 to 1943, inclusive, the total 
cost of the state government was 
$2,378,711,450 or $203,855,090 be­
low the total income of $2,582,- 
566,540.

“The Association's study of the 
situation was prompted by the 
fact that the petroleum industry

pays more than half of the busi­
ness and property taxes of the 
state. Production taxes levied 
against the industry are a major 
factor in reducing the deficit in 
the genera] fund. This deficit was 
cut approximately $18,000,000 in 
the last fiscal year.

Miss Geraldine Browder, grand­
daughter of Mrs. R. A  Chamber- 
lain and a friend, Miss Mary Ann 
Dunham of Ft. Worth, arrived 
Thursday evening to spend a few 
days with Mrs. Chamberlain.

eO M €IN A j||>

How to Save Gas, 
Tires and Time!

Bank by Mail - - • Pay by Check
More and more of our customers 
Bank-by-Mail and Pay-by-Check 
these days to save time, tires 
and gasoline in War-time.

No need at all to come to the 
Bank for ordinary transactions.
Every mail box is a teller’s 
window.

Come in, telephone or write for 
complete information. We gladly 
furnish special deposit envelopes 
and the few instructions needed 
so you can Bank-by-Mail with 
safetv and convenience.

fY>NLEY COUNTV 
u  STATE BANK I

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

PAY PROMPTLY •  KEEP YOUR CREDIT GOOD
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QUALITY AT SERVICE

Fa rm e rs  Eschan&e
GROCERY & MARKET

We Deliver Bring Us Your Cream &  Eggs Phone 63-J

BESTYETT

DRESSING
QUART

3 9 c

VINEGAR 1 2 c

CLEANSER l l r
LIGHTHOUSE—3  CANS .............................. *  ** ̂

TEA
JUNE BLOSSOMv« l b .

1 9 c

Macaroni or Spaghetti 2  5  C

CATSUP 1 7 c
GOLD BAR—8 OZ. BO TTLE ............................ * *  " ^

Sugar ; r  .32
r  l o u r  " m e , , c ‘ n , e* utv  SKI . 1 HM l  2 5 n>s........... ............A i 1 1 1 /

HJ-HO

CRACKERS
For Picnic Lunches

2 3 c

VEAL STEAK and ROAST
NO POINTS

WIENERS 2 8  c

Laundry Soap
CRYSTAL WHITE 
7  LARGE BARS

2 5 c

STEW MEAT 2 0 c

HOT BARBECUE
EVERY DAY

EVERY DAY AT OUR

DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT
Miltex Boys Sun Suits................. $ 1 5 9

DR ES S ES
NEW SHIPMENT

$ 4 9 5

Boys Fall 
JACKETS

All Slsee

$ 7 9 5  up

Ladies Hose................
NEW SHIPMENT

. $£01  up

Wool Crepe................. $ 2 6 9  up

Ladies Corduroy Slacks $ 4 9 5
Mens Work Pants........ $ 2 «  up

USE OUR LAY AWAY PLAN
BUY YOUR SCHOOL CLOTHES NOW I

► THE TEMPLE OP TRUTH •  
♦ •  ♦
0 By the Apoetle ♦
•  ♦

SOCIAL.
If the girl doesn’t watch her 

figure, the boys won’t.
♦  ♦  ♦

SUGGESTION.
He was a wise old man who 

said: “Goodness is the only invest­
ment that never fails.”

» ♦  ♦
OPINION.

Only recently I heard a war 
worker drawing $80.60 per week 
and, who had never before, pulled 
down more than $15 a week, kick­
ing about whiskey costing him 
$23.20 a gallon when bought in 
“fifth” bottles. You finish the 
statement.

MENTAL STATUS.
Happiness consists largely in

* A Him 
Memorial Service!

. . .  whether you pay 
$100 or $1,0001

Yes, everything complete 
regardless o f  what price  
m e m o r ia l  s e r v ic e  th e  
fam ily selects. As ser­
vants o f  those in distress 
we know  that th is is the  

#better, m ore kindly way. 
O ne ca ll, day o r  night, 
places everything in  cap-

MR. and MRS. FRED BUNT1N 
W. D. KIDD

Only Licsnssd Embalmers * 
In Donley County

RUNT IN FUNERAL HOME
Clarendon. Texas

being satisfied with what we have 
got, and what we haven't got.

♦  ♦  ♦

INVENTIVE STUFF.
Speaking of German inventions, 

the most important for their well­
being right now is a long pole 
with a white rag tied to it.

♦  ♦  ♦

ADVICE:
Ladies, see your dentist twice a 

year, and your hubby every pay 
day. (Some time I get $5 dollars 
for a crack like that.) <

♦  ♦ ♦  
OBSERVATION.

The female bathing suits of 1944 
are much like the barbed wire 
fences of the Panhandle. There is 
enough to protect the property 
without obstructing the view.

♦  ♦  ♦
DUMB ANIMALS.

Tell a man that there are bill­
ions of stars above, and he will be­
lieve it. But stick up a ‘fresh paint’ 
sign and the darn fool will dab his 
finger into the stuff to see if you 
have lied about it.

♦ ♦ ♦
The Old Apostle has no idea 

who wrote the screed for this col­
umn last week except that he or 
she has plumb plenty of gray 
hairs on his or her head. You have 
to live that interesting bit of his­
tory to know how to write it. Yep, 
the old man got back with a big 
batch of rocks, had a great time, 
did not get to stay long enough or 
see half enough. That’s always the 
way with these annual vacations 
that have been delayed two years.

Crofford spent Sunday with La- 
vern Marshall.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Land spent 
Sunday at Hedley.

Sgt. Russell Briggi spent the 
week end in the E. B. Allen home.

Gene Bulman and C. A. Ellis 
left Sunday with the F.F.A. boys
to visit Carlsbad Cavern and other 
parts in New Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. Virgel Jordan and 
family from Friona, Mrs. J. H. 
Easterling and Mrs. Roy Morrow 
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
J. T. Easterling.

The Quilting Club met with

Mrs. L. O. Christie August 10th 
with a large number present. Two 
quilts were finished. The next 
meeting will be at Mrs. W. H.
Morrow, Sept. 14.

Mrs. Wayne Morrow and child- 
ren*from Los Angeles and Mrs. 
Pete Morrow from Amarillo are
visiting Mrr and Mrs. W. II. Mor-
row.

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Rhoades of 
Lefors spent the week end with 
relatives. His mother, Mrs. Austin 
Rhoades accompanied them home 
for a weeks visit.

♦  M A R T I N  *

Sunday school was well attend­
ed Sunday with 44 present.

Mr. and Mrs. George Terry and 
family spent Sunday at Welling­
ton visiting his sister.

Mr. and Mrs. George Bulman 
and family spent the weekend at 
Lubbock visiting his sister and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Edd Harvey.

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Jordan and 
family are visiting her parents in 
Arkansas this week.

Mrs. Ray Roberson and children 
left Tuesday night to visit her 
husband who is in the service in 
Washington State.

Mr. Charles Adams and family 
from Anson visited in the Sulli­
van home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. George Bain and 
family from Dumas and Mr. and
M r», B u c k  H u b e r ts  u n d  M r. H u d - I
ges spent Sunday with Mr. and 

[ Mrs. J. D. Wood.
Mary Christie and Margie Nell

F E A T H E R
P I L L O W S

P a ir...........
LIMIT: Two pair to customer

$ 1 9 5

THESE PILLOW S are Arm y released and slightly  

soiled, bu t com pletely Sterilized.

CLOSE OUT ON ALL LAWN FURNITURE

LARGE SIZE - • ALL PORCELAIN

Gas and Butane Ranges

Use our Lay-Away Plan for your Gas Heaters. 

Terms as low as $1.25 per week.

Household Supply Co.
H O M E  O W N E D

C /Zps <Z?n 3 a ska rri, /  C rofts fl/a £ ece/

NEW FALL MERCHANDISE 
ARRIVING EVERY DAY!

MENS-
NEW FALL SUITES

HERRING BONE - DIAGONALS • STRIPES

FALL FELT HATS
STETSON - MALLORY

SPORT JACKETS
Newest Styles and Colors

S H O E S
FLORSHEIM - JARMAN - FORTUNE

LEATHER COATS AND JACKETS
Large Assortment Cowhide, Suede, Goat Skin

LADIES-

S K I R T S
Newest Styles and Colon

B L O U S E S
PRINT and JERSEY— Long and Short Sleeves

SLACK SUITS
New Fall Line

C O A T S
CHESTERFIELD and Boy Styles

L I N G E R I E
SUPS—Short and Long —  BRASSIERES 
PANTIES— Ladies mad Children Sizes 

Ladies and Girls HOSF .m l ANKLETS

BRYAN CLOTHING COMPANY
LADIES AND MEN’S WEAR
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Phone 45S
HUDSON—DEVER

Miss Helen Hudson became the 
bride of M M 1/c P. E. (Damper) 
Dever at her home here Tuesday 
at 12 o’clock high noon.

The single ring ceremony was 
performed by M. F. Manchester, 
pastor of the Church of Christ.

The bride wore a light blue two 
piece Jersey dress with black ac­
cessories.

Mrs. Dever is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Hudson of 
Wellington, Texas. She received 
her education in the Wellington, 
Amarillo and Lubbock schools. 
For the past three years she has 
been employed as a clerk in the 
Greene Dry Goods Store.

The bridegroom is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. U. T. Dever of Clar­
endon. He attended Clarendon 
schools, finishing Clarendon Jun­
ior College here. For the past 18 
months he has been in overseas 
service with the Navy.

Following the wedding cere­
mony, a reception was held at the 
home of the bride. Those present 
were Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Hudson 
and daughter Viola of Wellington; 
Mr. and Mrs. U. T. Dever, Mr. and 
Mrs. A1 Dever, Mr. and Mis. A. B. 
Turner, Mrs. Weldon Harkness 
and two children, Mrs. Damon 
Pharr, Miss Martha Reimer and 
Miss Rhoda Wiedman.

After a brief vacation, the bride 
will continue work at Greene’s 
and the groom will return to the 
armed service.

ENTERTAIN WITH 
LAWN PARTY

Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Trout enter­
tained with a lawn party Tuesday 
August 8th, honoring Mrs. Trout’s 
brother, C M 3/c Bruce (Tubby) 
Tidwell and family. Forty-two 
was played, after which refresh­
ments of home-made ice cream 
and cookies were served to the 
following guests;

Mary Williams, Inethia Corn- 
best, Bud Anderson, Mrs. Lucille 
Swinney, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Wil­
son, Mr. and Mrs. Guy Sibley, Mr. 
and Mrs. Chester Talley, Mr. and 
Mrs. Glen Adkins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Eddings and Joyce, Mr. and 
Mrs. Cecil Thomas and Annette, 
Mr. and Mrs. Wendell Smith and 
Dale. Mr. and Mrs. O. H. Tidwell 
and Sandye, Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
Tidwell and Margaret, Mr. and 
Mrs. Pete Borden and plenda Lee, 
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Trout.

OLA JEAN PITTMAN 
CELEBRATES EIGHTH 
BIRTHDAY SATURDAY

Ola Jean Pittman celebrated her 
8th birthday Saturday afternoon, 
with a party at her home. Games 
were played on the lawn, then the 
gifts were opened by the honoree.

Refreshments of smacks, punch 
and cake were served. Those pres­
ent were Willeta Riney, Barbara 
Estlack, Doris Crawford, Cynthia 
Thornberry, Joyce Eddings, Shir­
ley Tipton, Freddie Shelley, Billy 
Carl and Keith Pittman, Mrs. Guy 
Shelley and Mrs. Jack Eddings.

FOR SALE
ON OUR LIST OF FARMS THIS WEEK WE HAVE A 
GOOD 320 ACRE STOCK FARM, CROP, (40 head of
wkVH f t c *  n H h > .  T U t M S  —  I m u B s t f  p s m i r t o s ,  m > 4

cash payment, and time and terms oa balance.

200 ACRES OF BEST LAND IN DONLEY COUNTY One 
mile from pavement on rural bus and mail route. TIME 
and TERMS TO SUIT.

Geo. Ryan
P honos 92 • 89

GOLDEN WEDDING 
ANNIVERSARY

One of the most pleasing social 
events of the season was the cele­
bration of the Golden Wedding of 
the Pastor of the First Christian 
Church, Rev. L. Guy Ament and 
Mrs. Ament.

This pastor and wife have made 
for themselves a very definite 
place in the community life, as 
was evidenced by this celebration 
at the First Christian Church on 
Sunday, August 6th, from 3 to 5 
o’clock. The occasion was sponsor­
ed by the membership of the 
church and a general invitation 
was given to all friends.

The spacious auditorium of the 
church was tastefully decorated 
with flowers, while lace-draped 
tables, loaded with beautiful and 
valuable gifts, bore testimony to 
the esteem in which the recipients 
were held.

The guests were greeted by 
Mesdames Frank White Sr., W. T. 
Hayter, G. A. Anderson, G. D. 
Shelley. Mrs. E. C. Herd presided 
over the Bride’s Boojc, while Mes­
dames Homer Mulkey, J. D. Swift, 
Lloyd Benson and Misses Janice 
Benson and Patty Pittman were in 
charge of the gift tables.

To the ever-beautiful, ever- 
stirring strains of the Wedding 
March, played by Mrs. Page Har­
mon, the bride and groom of fifty 
years led the bridal procession in 
front of the flower-decked altar, 
followed by Roy Clampitt, Chair' 
man of the Christian Church 
Board, Mrs. Roy Clampitt, Super­
intendent of the Primary Depart­
ment of the Sunday school, Rev. 
Hal Upchurch, pastor of the Bap­
tist Church and his wife, Mrs. Hal 
Upchurch, Mrs. Ruth Jacobus, fos­
ter daughter of the Aments and 
her own small son, Guy Alan; 
Rev. John S. Ellis, pastor of the 
Presbyterian Church; F r a n k  
White Jr., Supt. of the Christian 
Sunday School and his wife, Mrs. 
Frank White Jr.; Mrs. Kate John­
son and Mrs. Marian Williams, 
Charter members of the church; 
Mrs. C. A. Burton, Secretary of 
Home Service of Red Cross, and 
Frank White Sr., member of the 
official board of the church.

Rev. Hal Upchurch prayed an 
inspiring prayer of dedication; 
Mrs. Clampitt sang "I Love You 
Truly", accompanied by Mrs. 
Harmon, and Mrs. Burton read 
two of Edgar A. Guest’s poems, 
"Wife O'Mine,” and “Success,’’ 
closing with Robert Burns’ im-
mnrUI "lohnAagSkMVMy So.**

Then while refreshments were 
being served by Mesdames Ernest 
Hunt and Joe Ritter at the table, 
assisted by Mesdames Mary Doz­
ier, N. S. Percival, J. Bowles anfl 

%!isses Arline Dozier, Frances 
Peabody, Joan Ritter and Jeanie 
Pittman, the Lions Club quartette, 
Messrs. R. E. Drennan, W. D. Kidd 
and Rayburn Smith sang a group 
of old familiar songs including 
“When You and I Were Young, 
Mollie” and “Let Me Call You 
Sweetheart.” Mrs. J. H. Howze 
sang “Just a Song at Twilight," 
and Jimmie Dean Howze played 
two clarinet solos and a piano 
solo.

The Brides cake, which she her­
self had baked, was cut by the 
bride of fifty years, assisted by the 
smiling groom, and amidst the

congratulations and good wishes 
of the scores of friends, they be­
gan the second-lap of the martial 
journey.

—One of the Guests.

CHURCH COUNCIL
Mrs. Millard Word, President of 

the Council of Church Women an­
nounces the next regular meeting 
of the Council will be held at the 
Presbyterian Church on August 
30th. Executive Boar'd members 
are asked to meet promptly at 
9:45 so that the general meeting 
may begin at 10:00. Mrs. Word 
will have charge of the program 
which will consist mainly of a 
round-table discussion on affairs 
particularly interesting to council 
members. The regular meeting 
will be followed by a covered-dish 
luncheon and each member is ask­
ed to bring a covered dish.

Mrs. Pete Kunz, Vice President 
and Chairman of the Membership 
Committee, urges each Church 
throughout Donley County to 
send one or more delegates to this 
meeting. Due to the gasoline and 
tire shortage, she has been unable 
to personally contact all churches 
but they are cordially invited to 
be represented. Purpose of the or­
ganization will be thoroughly ex 
plained at this meeting. If your 
church has not been contacted, 
please appoint yourself a commit­
tee of one to see that you have 
representatives at the August 30th 
meeting.

WINDY VALLEY CLUB
The Windy Valley Club met 

Wednesday, August 9th. Mrs. 
John Hutson was hostess. One 
quilt was quilted.

Members present were Mrs. 
Shaw, Mrs. Anderson, Mrs. Carl 
Barker, Mrs. Mills, Mrs. Hutson 

Mrs. Mills will be hostess Aug­
ust 23rd. At this meeting Mrs. 
Mills will be given a shower.

BOOK CLUB COFFEE
Mrs. L. T. Shelton with Mrs. 

Alfred McMurtry and Mrs. Bill 
Bromley as co-hostesses entertain­
ed the members of the 1926 Book 
Club with a coffee Thursday 
morning. Garden flowers were 
used in the entertaining rooms.

Coffee was poured from a linen- 
covered table by Mrs. Shelton for 
the following members; Mrs. Bill 
Ray, Mrs. Rolle Brumley, Mrs. 
Frank Phelan, Mrs. Elba Ballew, 
Mrs. Charlie Bairficld. Mrs. Frank 
White, Mrs. Chas. Lowry, Mrs. M. 
R. Allensworth, Mrs. B. G. Wat­
son, Mrs J. R. Porter, Mrs. L. N. 
Cox, Miss Lucile Polk.

Patsy Pittman is visiting her 
grandmother, Mrs. Dora Adkins, 
and other relatives in Amarillo.

CLARENDON H. D. CLUB
The Clarendon H. D. Club will 

meet Friday, August 18th iq all 
day meeting at the home of Mrs. 
J. C. Estlack. Mrs. Claude Darden 
and Mrs. Clyde Butler will be as­
sisting hostesses.

EPISCOPAL CHURCH OF 
ST. JOHN BAPTIST 

The Rit. Frank H. Hutchins, M.A. 
Clergyman

Mr. Walter B. Knorpp 
Lay Reader

SUNDAY. AUGUST 20th 
The Eleventh Sunday after 

Trinity.
11:00 a. m. — Morning Prayer 

and Sermon—Mr. Knorpp.

morning. I will preach there Mon­
day night and each day and night 
throughout the week. Closing the 
meeting at the morning hour Aug­
ust 27th.

We urge ail our people to be 
much in prayer for the success of 
the meeting. We earnestly request 
the cooperation of all the Christ­
ian people of the community. We 
will begin our revival meeting at 
Ashtola the night of August 27th. 
We hope the Christian people 
there will make the necessary 
preparations for a gracious re­
vival. Our meeting begins here 
in Clarendon the first Sunday in 
September and will run for one 
week only. Let each of us be pray­
erful and follow God’s leadership 
that much good may be accom­
plished.

CARD OF THANKS
We take this means of thapking 

our friends and neighbors for 
their deeds of kindness and words 
of condolence during the illness 
and death of our dear loved one. 
May God’s richest blessings be 
yours is our sincere prayer.

N. L. Murff and Family.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
L. Guy Ament. Pastor

Next Sunday at 11 a. m. ser­
vices will be held as usual, but 
let’s worship in an unusual way. 
Be there for worship and in tune 
with the Divine.

Evening Services at 8:30.
On Wednesday evening at 8:30 

we meet for devotional service 
and Bible study. Do you know all 
you wish to know about Bible 
teaching? The admonition is for us 
to study.

THE METHODIST. CHURCH 
H. W. Hanks. Pastor

Sunday school at 9:45. Preach­
ing at 10:30. Bro. Calmer will 
preach for us at this hour. There 
will be no service at the evening 
hour. Bro. Palmer will also preach 
at Goldston immediately after tKe 
service here Sunday morning. He 
will preach there that night. This 
will be the beginning of our re­
vival meeting there at Goldston. 
We will have no service Monday

Ray Darden who has been ill in 
the Veterans hospital at Amarillo 
Was able to visit his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Claude Darden a few 
days last week.

Mrs. Dorothy Adamson and 
Mrs. Wayne McElroy are now in 
the Clyde Butler apartments. 
Wayne left Monday for Camp 
Howze, Gainsville, Texas.

Mrs. Edgar Brittian and son 
Terry who have been visiting her 
mother, Mrs. Lea, left for their 
home at Ironton Monday.. 

________ l_________
Lorene Gunter who is employ­

ed by the government at the Ama­
rillo Army Air Field is visiting 
her mother, Mrs. W. C. Gunter, 
and brother, Pvt. W. C. Gunter Jr.

Fern Martin and S/Sgt. Allen 
Jones from Amarillo visited her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
Martin Friday evening.

______Thursday. August 17. 1144
Sgt. Rhodin Studder and wife* 

from Alexandria, La. visited his 
cousin, Mrs. A. L. Chase Thurs­
day. He is being sent to Lake 
Tahoe, Calif. They were going by 
Gunnison, Cola and visit his cou­
sin and family, Mr. and Mrs. Keith 
Stegall who have recently moved 
there from Kingsmill.

Mr. and Mrs. W. W. Crawford 
and daughter, Mrs. Nina Gates 
and Fred Buntin have returned 
home from a fishing trip near 
Vernon.

Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Bain of 
Dumas, Billy Bain and wife of 
S. C., Mr. and Mrs. Chester Hod­
ges and family of Hereford, Mr. 
and Mrs. Buck Roberts, Ed Hod­
ges and Miss Della Wood were 
guests in the J. D. Wood home 
Sunday.

Mrs. N. S. Percival has as her 
guests this week, Mr. and Mrs. J.. 
W. Toler and family of Amarillo,. 
Mr. and Mrs. Phillips Bianchi and 
daughter, Beverly Jean of Santa 
Rosa, Calif.

Pvt. Milton Landers came Tues­
day for a two days visit with hi» 
brother. Alvin Landers. He is on 
his way from Atlanta to Seattle.

Mr. and Mrs. R. C- Taylor of Ft. 
Worth and Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Mc­
Dowell from Pampa visited their 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Vada Carpen­
ter and other relatives last week.

Mr. and Mrs. D. Galbraith of 
Shamrock visited their son Mr. 
and Mrs. Wendell Smith and fam­
ily over the week end.

R A D IO
REPAIRING

ELECTRIC A BATTERY 
RADIO SETS FOR SALE

Lees Radio Shop
AT

HOUSEHOLD SUPPLY CO.
Phone8

1

Wm,

H I G H  ! 
Q U A L IT Y  

M E A T S
Complete Assortment of 

HOME-KILLED 
BEEF and PORK 
CURED MEATS 

Assorted Lunch Moats

PROTECT YOUR INVESTMENT

P A I N T F I X - U P
Ripolin Enamels Pittsburgh Paints

VALSPAR VARNISH 
AND PLENTY OF ALUMINUM PAINT

a

A  new coat of Paint or Varnish on your woodwork not 
only brightens the beauty of your home but also gives it 
a protection against weather and hard usage. It costs 
less to keep your home in good repair minutely than let­
ting it go until you have a really expensive job to pay for.

\ ~
PIPE AND WINDMILL SUPPLIES —  PLUMBING SUPPLIES

BUILDERS HARDWARE

See us for your Lumber Needs - • • Lumber is still Available for Essential Needs.

Foxworth - Galbraith

CRACKERS
OYSTER—8 fr. B o x ................................... 59c APRICOTS

BR1MFULL— N O . 2V, C A N ............... 30c]
TOMATO SOUP
CAMPBELLS-CAN ................................ 10c P E A R S

RIO RITA—NO. 2VZ C A N .............. 27c.
TOMATO JUICE
KUNERS-CAN .......................................

*12c PEACHES
RIO RITA— NO. 2V* C A N .............. 25c 1

M ELONS
POUND

l / c
NICE FRESH

Cantaloupes
EACH

Pork Roast 
S te a k

(No Points) 

POUND . . .

ioc LARD
FRESH HOME-GROWN

C O R N
6 FOR

FLY SPRAY
P. D. —Quest 35c
PORK A BEANS
Marshalls—No. 2 Vi Can 18c
PINTO BEANS
No. 2Vi Can . . . 15c

FAMILY STYLE
(S Points)  ̂
POUND ..............

PURE HOG |  '  £

P ou n d .............................. X  €

p r u n es  r r
Fresh—G allon.......  ..............  U « fC

PEAS I E
Mission—No. 2 Can .........   I w C

h o n ey  m  n r
New Crop—S lb. J a r  ........... $  la V V

Clarendon FOOD Store
• • . * \ . r t

W E  D E L I V E R  w e  b u y  c r e a k , p o u l t r y , e g g s  and  h i d e s  P H O N E ___ 4 3
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* Advertisements •

F O R  R E N T
FOR RENT—Two room upstairs 

apartment after August 15th. 
Adults only. Phone 404 or see 
Mrs. Fannie Wilson.____ (25tfc)

F O R  S A L E

FOR SALE — 1941 Nash, 4-pas- 
senger coupe. See W. W. Jones 
at Lelia Lake. (24-2c)

Aiella Sras pwxHscr which m. • “".PnM  htaling ot rnlrnml CooTaoiaat akakn-rap caa,
5V« « « K i., 11.00— only a liola to

Stocking's Drug Storo
(Our 60th Year)

FOR SALE — Very choice dairy 
heifers $25 each! Holsteins, 
Guernseys and Ayrshires. Non- 
related bull free with 5 head. 
Shipped C. O. D.

Sayra Dairy Cattle Co., 
Sayre, Pa.

(30-c)
FOR SALE—7-room stucco house 

with bath and out houses. Lo­
cated close to Junior High 
School. See C. T. McClenny or 
phone 497-W. <26tfc)

FOR SALE— Large Concord and 
Rodgers grapes at $2.00 per 
bushel. See Mrs. M. M. Barton.

(27-p)

CHARM-KURL PERMANENT 
WAVE, 5 9 11 More than six 
million women h a v e  given 
themselves Charm-Kurl Home 
Permanent Waves. Absolutely 
harmless, easy to do. Thrill to 
the joy of natural-looking curls 
and waves. Wonderful fpr child­
ren’s hair.,

Douglas k  Golds ton
(31-p)

FOR SALE— Cream or Blackeye 
Peas. Phone 933-F5 or see Mrs. 
Geo. McKee. (26-c)

P E E R L E S S  SCREW WORM 
KILLER and Peerless Fly Re- 

and Government Form­
ula 62 at

Stocking's Drug Store
(14-p)

Call us for Window and Auto 
Glass. You always save at— 

Hudson It Taylors 
THE PAINT STORE

(47tfc)

THE DOlfLET COUNTY LEADEN

SALESMEN WANTED
LOOK HERE! WANTED MEN 

AND WOMEN—to start in busi­
ness on our capital. Sell some 
200 Farm-Home Products in 
Donley a n d  Collingsworth 
Counties. Thousands of our 
Dealers now make quick sales, 
big profits. For particulars 
write Rawleigh’s, Dept. TXH- 
135-192, Memphis, Tenn.

(26-c)

-PAGE FTVN

MITES St BLUE BUGS —Easily 
exterminated with AVENAR- 
IUS CARBOLINEUM. Guaran­
teed remedy.

Stocking's Drug Store
(19,p)

CARLOAD OF PIANOS just ar­
rived. Coifte early and get your 
choice. 1026B West 6th Street, 
Amarillo. (25-4c)

FOR SALE—1-5-Bumer Oil Stove 
good condition. See G. W. Brad­
shaw at Frank Whitlock place.

(26-p)
FOR SALE — Used Overstuffed 

Divan and Chair. Phone 274-J 
or see Carl B. Adams. (25-c)

(M a y .
Pink Eye Powder
Slope'pink eye louts E u y  to apply. 
Quick to ad . B a n k  which Mils foe 
•1.00 treats M  to 40 cases.

Stocking's Drug Store
(Our 60th Year)

Wallpaper, Paints, gloss, linoleum, 
Furniture. You always save at 

Hudson k  Taylors 
THE PAINT STORE

(47tfc)

See us for all types Ideal built in 
cabinets, medicine cabinets, 
bath room cabinets. You always 
save at—

Hudson k Taylors 
THE PAINT STORE

(7tfc)

If you have a used Ice Box for 
sale, just call Household Supply 
Co. No. 8. (22tfc)

WANTED—To buy your Used 
Furniture. Household Supply 
Co. Phone 8. (20tfc)

Come in and see our new and 
modern wallpaper display, 
showing wall, ceiling and bord­
er as it looks on your wall. You 
always save at—

Hudson k  Taylors 
THE PAINT STORE

(7tie)

We will buy your used Furniture. 
You always save at—

Hudson k Taylors 
THE PAINT STORE

(47tfc)

[ TO OUR STORK

We carry a complete line of 
Kemtone. The miracle wall 
finish.

Hudson k Taylors 
THE PAINT STORE

(ltfc)

Calf Proscription
A  proved formula w hich Mop* Io m m  

PIMB ao-callad calf acoura of dto- 
origin. Large bottle treata aev-

FOR SALE—480 acre farm seven 
miles west of Clarendon. Write 
or call Boyd Meador, McLean, 
Texas. (26-p)

fir
tanr , _
era) cmaca. 91.00.

Stocking's Drug Store
(Our 60th Year)

FOR SALE!—Two hundred pound 
Butane gas drums. No priority 
required.

Thompson Bros. Co.
(9tfc)

FOR SALE—Large Perfection Oil 
heater Inquire at Leader office.

(3tfc>

MtJMClg
w all rmnm

Thompson Bros. Co.
Clarendon. Texas

FOR SALE—D-T Carbolated Cre- 
sote Base. Kills and Repeli 
Mites, Fowl Ticks (Blue Bugs) 
and Repels Termites. Wood Pre­
server and Disinfectant 
Thomas Mill and Food Storo 

(29-tfc)
We have an exceptional fine line 
of mirrors, priced to sell. You al­

ways save at—
Hudson k Taylors 

THE PAINT STORE 
Phone 82-M

(ltfc)

W A N T E D
WANTED — Sewing machine 
and Vacuum Cleaner repairs 
and parts. Any and all makes 
repaired and work guaranteed 
Cooper Sewing Machine Store, 
119 N. Frost, Pampa, Texas. 
Phone 364. (29-p)

LOST and FOUND
LOST—Jade Bracelet, made in 

Old Mexico. Reward. Mrs. H. T. 
Warner. (26-c)

Mrs. Morton from Davis, Okla 
and Mrs. Fred Wewerka and chil­
dren Freddy and Hat from El 
reno, Okla. are visiting relatives 
here in Clarendon. Mrs. Morton 
was Grace Taylor before her mar­
riage.

Mrs. David Johnson left Wed 
nesday for Wellington to be with 
her granddaughter, Rosemary 
Bourland who was operated on 
for ruptured appendix.

Mr. and Mrs. Will Johnson and 
daughter Muble left (today) 
Thursday for Hot Springs, N. M 
for Mrs. Johnson's health.

T/ Sgt. Johnny Grady and wife 
are visiting homefolks. Johnny 
has recently returned from over 
seas in Italy.

H U D G I N S
Mrs. S. M. Harp

There tfas a good crowd out for 
Sunday school and preaching Sun.'

We are sorry to report Grand­
ma Perdue on the sick list at this 
time.

Mr. and Mrs. R. W. Webb and 
Mr. and Mrs. Alton Webb and 
baby, Dan Tims, Bill Perdue, Imo- 
gene Elliott and Jerry Perdue 
took Sunday dinner in the J. L. 
Talley home.

Mr. and Mrs. D. L. Jacobs and 
Wayne of Lark, Texas and Mr. 
und Mrs. L. O. Christie, Drew and 
Nelson of Martin called on Mr. 
and Mrs. O. L. Jacobs Sunday.

Mrs. Estelle Foster and Eureda 
of Clarendon spent Sunday in the 
Otto Elliott home.

Velma Tims visited with Mary 
Nell Perdue Sunday.

Bro. Goodnight and Bro. Duren 
and Mr. and Mrs. L. C. Tims and 
Clyde took dinner in the Harp 
home Sunday, and those to call in 
the afternoon were Mr. and Mrs. 
D. L. Jacobs and son, Mr. and Mrs 
L. O. Christie and sons, Nelson 
Seago, N. M. McGlone, Jackie und 
Melvin Fowlkes.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Moffit and 
daughter and Mr. and Mrs. Emery 
Talley and children of Clarendon 
visited in the J. C. Perdue home 
Sunday.

Ben Talley and Bill Perdue 
spent part of last week in Ama­
rillo and Lubbock.

Pvt. Herman Vinson, wife and 
baby from Bryan, Texas are visit­
ing his mother, Mrs. L. E. Vinson.

Cpl. Leon Vinson from Long 
Island, N. Y. visited his mother, 
Mrs. L. E. Vinson last week.

Mrs. J. D. Browder and daugh­
ter of Memphis visited last week 
with Mrs. R. A. Chamberlain.

Treva Trussel 
end in Amarillo.

spent the week

T. J. Noland, father, of E. H. 
Noland, is ill in a hospital at Amu- 
rillo.

Miss Bobby Nell Pittman of 
Hereford visited last week in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Carl Pitt­
man.

Pvt. W. C. Gunter Jr. from San 
Diego, Calif, is here on furlough 
visiting his mother, Mrs. W. C. 
Gunter.

H. A. Blanton, former resident, 
is visiting friends and relatives in 
this section at this time. H. A. is 
in the Uncle’s service at present.

Mr. and Mrs. W. I. Rains of 
Hedley were interested visitors 
here Wednesday meeting their 
many friends.

J. D. Dotson, a resident of many 
years of Lelia Lake, passed away 
at Morton, Texas Monday of last 
week. Burial was in Clarendon.

Rev. J. W. Oiler of Vernon is 
visiting his niece and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. W. W. Crawford.

S/Sgt. and Mrs. C. L. Smith of 
Camp Claiborn, La. visited her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. R. C. 
Weatherly the first of the week.

J. C. Estlack returned home 
Sunday from a 2-weeks vacation 
trip in New Mexico, Arizona and 
Old Mexico.

Mrs. Roscoe Crafton, who had 
been called to the bedside of a 
sister-in-law in Oklahoma, stop­
ped over here Tuesday for a visit 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
A. Warren, on her return to Ama­
rillo.

Henry Jones of Amarillo was 
here on business and visiting the 
Pete Koontz family Monday.

J. A. Warren was in Amarillo 
on business Tuesday.

Mr. J. B. Masterson, prominent 
Hedley farmer, was here on busi­
ness Wednesday.

Fred Buntin 
Tuesday.

was in Amarillo

Mr. and Mrs. Emmett Gill are 
visiting her daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Victor Smith and family.

Mrs. Frankie Moore from Cor­
dell, Okla. is visiting her sister, 
Mrs. J. L. McMurtry.

Miss Kittie Carroll of Long 
Beach, Calif, is visiting in the 
Wesley Knorpp home.

Emma Jean Mears who spent 
last week in the Victor Smith 
home has returned home. Arva- 
zene Smith accompanied her home 
for a week’s visit.

;e assortment of 
Spring-filled Living Room 
Furniture

F U L L
S I Z E

GAS
RANGES

NOW
AVAILABLE

for Natural Gas 
and Butane

C L A R E N D O N  
FURNITURE STORE

P. O. 3/c James Marvin Clark 
from the submarine base at San 
D ie g o , C a l i f .  ml v i s i t i n g  h i s  par­
ents Ohd fSmnJfcJltr. «'ina Mfc. T. 

11-layS. Clark on a lay furlough.
------7--------- ----------------

Billy Jack Shelky. who recently 
entered the Navy, is now station­
ed in Farragut, Idaho. Those wish­
ing to wpte to Billy Jack can use 
the following address. Billy Jack 
Shelley a/s Co.-808 - 44. Camp 
Bennion U. S. N. T. C., Farragut, 
Idaho.

C M 3/c Bruce Tidwell and fam­
ily left Wednesday night for Cali­
fornia. Tubby will report back to 
his ship. His wife pnd baby make 
their home in Lo* Angeles, Calif.

Mrs. M. F. Haile returned home 
today from Amarillo hospital 
where she underwent an eye oper­
ation. She is reported to be doing 
fine.

Mrs. James Patman and son 
Tommy left Thursday (today) for 
her home at Pleasanton, Kansas 
after a visit with James’ parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Patman.

Mr. C. H. Ellis has returned 
home from Levelland where he 
has been visiting his daughter, 
Mrs. Erwin Gerlach.

Elaine and Leroy Landers of 
Pampa are visiting their cousins, 
Mary Ann and Don Landers this 
week.

Cpl. David McCleskey of Lake 
Charles, La. is home on furlough 
visiting his family and parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. H. McCleskey.

. Lt. Frank Phelan Jr., son of Mr. 
Frank Phelan of this city is now 
somewhere in England. He is con­
nected with the Quartermaster 
Corps.

Mrs. Alvin Benton from Ama­
rillo was a weekend guest in the 
J. L. McMurtry home.

Mrs. Jack Latson will leave Sat. 
for Memphis to make ,her home 
with her mother, Mrs. Carrie 
Davis.

Bob Bentley returned home 
from Ft. Worth Sat. where he has 
been w t' king.

Cpl. J. T. Sykes of Tonapah. 
Nev. is home on furlough visiting 
his family. He is a Celestial Navi­
gation trainer operator and in­
structor. - •—*..........-

Marmalade
SCULLY’S CITRUS 

(No Points)
2 LB. JAR

19 c
F L O U R

SILVER PEAKS 

2 5  LB. SACK

5 J1 9

Super Suds
WHITE KING, HYLO

Large Siza Pkg. 

EACH

These Food Prices for FRIDAY, 
SA T U R D A Y  and M ONDAY

P E A S
LEADER BRAND 

NO. 2  CAN

10c
per Case, 24 C ans___ $2.25

DILL DRESSING
Monarch—5 os. B o ttle ................................ 18cvlrtU. lagJTi
GOLD DUST
Scouring Powder, round Pkg. —Each . . . 5c
HY-TEX
Washes dishes without wiping—Large Pkg. 19c
WASHO
New improved granulated Soap—Large Pkg. 23c
BORAX WASHING COMPOUND 
Large Pkg. ...................... m
RAIN DROPS
Large Pkg.

CLEANSER
Crystal White, Cleans, scrubs and Scours—2 Cans for

PEP-ADE
Summer drink, any flavor- -Each

23c
H e

4c
PEARS
Rio Rite. No. 2 ,/2 Can—2 for ....... 55c
ORANGE JUICE 
Adams No. 2 Cans—2 for 45c
ORANGE JUICE. 46 oi. Cans—2 for $ 1 .0 5
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE
Marco. 46 os. Cans—3 fo r .................................. $1.00

PER CASE .................................. ................  $ 3 .9 0
PUDDING A  A
The Bjest. Cocoanut, Vanilla. Caramel—3 Pkg. Carton . L y C

MUSTARD
Edwards—9 os. Jars ......................................... 5c
CRACKERS
Johnson—2 lb. Box ........................................... 25c
FRUIT JARS — JAR RINGS — TIN CANS — BINDER TWINE

—IN OUR MARKET—
Wa have the largest assortment of choice cuts of extra fancy 
home killed grain fed baby beef for your selection at all time*. 
Also a complete assortment of Lunch meats—HAM k BACON. 
Shop here for your meats with Quality.

HOT BARBECUE DAILY

Hog Lard
Home Rndertd  

POUND

17c

CLIFFORD & RAY
'  GROCERIES & MEATS

COLD STORAGE LOCKER SERVICE IN CONNECTION

Phone 5 We Deliver Phone 6
———
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A Texas sergeant serving in 
France wrote the following report 
of the fighting there:

“The Texas army is advancing 
steadily on Paris and will be in 
Berlin before long." As an after­
thought, he added: “We are taking 
along with us some units from 
other states, to show them how.” 

It isn’t exactly like that, per­
haps, but there are so many Tex­
ans in the battle for France that 
at times it must seem that a Lone 
Star army really is there in force.

Sgt. Bob Jackson of San Marcos, 
fighting in Italy, used an old Tex 
as trick to wipe out a group of em­
battled Nazis. When he found 
himself unable to use his grenade 
thrower because a chicken-wire 
fence was between him and the 
Nazis, he jumped • into an old 
building, captured a German

Dr. J. Gordon Stewart
PHYSICIAN  A SURGEON

Office in Latson Bldg. 

Ground Floor 
Office Phone 239 

Residence Phone 253

sniper, and used him as a shield 
while advancing on the enemy 
strong point. Then with grenades 
and rifle fire, he drove out the 
Nazis, capturing six more.

Enemy planes aren't as num­
erous over France these days as 
they once were, but Capt. Burt 
Marshall of Greenville managed 
to find one recently. He quickly 
shot it down. Other Texas airmen 
who have been cited or decorated 
for air victories include Lt. M. M. 
Tomme, Navy pilot from Troup; 
Lt. (jg) Roy Bechton of Lubbock 
and Ensign Jack Hogue of Gra­
ham, each of whom was credited 
with shooting down one or more 
Japs. Ensign Hogue failed to re­
turn after the fight

On the home front Texans are 
also helping win the war. Few 
men are doing more than the vol­
unteer division, region and county 
leaders chosen to spearhead the 
coming campaign for the National 
War Fund. Under direction of 
Wayland D. Towner, general man 
ager of the United War Chest of 
Texas, they will help put the na­
tion’s biggest state-wide drive 
over the top, and are now work­
ing at top speed recruiting work­
ers and perfecting local campaign 
organizations.

The National War Fund finan­
ces USO, War Prisoners Aid and 
17 other agencies serving our own 
fighting men and our allies.

Lucky is Pfc. Jose Lopez, a 
t o u g h  Brownsville scrapper. 
Fighting in Normandy ,the Texan 
was hit squarely in the body by a 
bullet. The impact spun him a- 
round, but Lopez recovered his 
balance and with one bullet killed 
the German who had fired the 
shot. Then he discovered why he 
was not wounded—the Nazi bullet 
had hit an ammunition clip at his 
belt, and lodged there.

A FEED for EVERY NEED
any kind of food for stock or poultry I 

to Inapert our stock, for wo guar into* It to bo gos
o

Custom Grinding
Wo oro equipped to do your 
tt done. Profit more by

grinding any way you

Thomas Mill & Feed Store

This t r a i l e r /^

this cottage

this mansion

all get the same

electric service!
WAR has moved many American families into new living 
quarters. But, whatever the sixe of their homes, they til  get 
exactly the same dependable electric service.

Oh, sure, some folks may light more rooms and use more 
appliances than you do. But the service and the quality of 
the electricity you receive remain the same. You can’t buy 
an “exclusive” grade.

Electricity is also the one service whose cost has remained 
l°w—while the cost of living in general has been going up. 
Whoa, you say? Your bill’s been more over the years? Well, 
that’s because you’re now using electricity to keep food, 
wash clothes, clean rugs, tell time and make music—where 
once you used it only for light.

The truth is, the average American family today gets 
about twice as much electricity for its money as it uiu 13 
years ago! And we, your friends and neighbors, are proud 
to be one of the many electric companies under basinet* 
management, bringing you this bargain.

WfestTexas U tilities
Company

Texas’ share in the war was 
commemorated again last week, 
when a new giant troopship was 
named for a famous Texas soldier, 
Gen. W. P. Richardson, who was 
born at Hunt. The ship was 
launched at Newark, N. J.

And here is a partial list of Tex­
ans who have been decorated for 
bravery and outstanding service: 
Lt. Lloyd Kelly, Coleman, Air 
Medal cluster; Lt. Col. Ed Harris, 
El Paso, Sgt. Joe Ellis, Orange, 
and Sgt. Ban Wyatt Jr., Brown- 
wood, Bronze Stars; Capt. Jim 
Dooley, Dilley, and Andrew 
Block, Bonham, Soldiers Medals 
for heroism in saving lives of 
comrades, and the following Tex­
ans who received Distinguished 
Flying Crosses for fighting over 
Europe; Lt. Luther Abel, Glade- 
water; Lt. Charles Summers, 
Granbury; Capt. Morris Stanley, 
Alvin; Sgt. Hershel Moore, Del 
Rio, and Lt. Wade Knudson, Meri­
dian, Sgt. im Daugherty of Imper­
ial won the coveted Air Medal.

Texas fighting men in France 
are now getting full services of 
the various National War Fund 
agencies. United Seamens Service, 
USO-Camp Shows and War Pris­
oners Aid all are operating on the 
continent, as are French Relief 
and other NWF service units.

J GOLDSTON J
♦  Wilma Smith ♦

A larger number was out for 
Sunday school Sunday morning. 
The Methodist Revival meeting is 
to begin next Sunday, so everyone 
come.

We are sorry to report the pass­
ing of Mrs. Hubert Johnson. Mrs. 
Johnson had been in ill health for 
a number of months. Mr. Johnson 
and family have our deepest 
sympathy in the loss of their dear 
one.

Nancy Helton of Groom visited 
with her aunts and uncles, Mr. 
and Mrs. Neely Hudson and son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Eichelberger 
and Mr. and Mrs. Roy Stewart last 
week.

Mrs. Neely Hudson and Dwayne 
visited with her mother, Mrs. H. 
M. Stewart awhile Saturday even­
ing.

Mrs. Mattie Hudson is spend­
ing this week with her son and 
wife, Mr. and Mrs. Major Hudson 
of Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Les White of Well- 
I i n g t o n  s p e n t  S a t u r d a y  e v e n i n g !  
’ with Mr. and Mrs. Bill Higdon 
| Miss Anita Cook of Plainview 
spent one night last week with 
Mr. and Mrs. Edd Mooring and 
family.

Bobbie, Ina May, Era June and 
Orrin Brock left Saturday for 
Arkansas where they will visit

relatives and friends a few days.
Betty Fern Higdon spent last 

week with her brother and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. WiUard Higdon of 
Claude.

Mr. and Mi». Houges spent part 
of last week with their daughter 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hig­
don.

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Mooring and 
family were dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Littlefield and fam­
ily one day last week.

Very few attended the singing 
Sunday evening.

Mrs. Murphy Brock left Monday 
evening for Arkansas where she 
will visit relatives a few days.

Doyle Ray Littlefield spent Sat­
urday night and Sunday with 
Billie Smith.

Mrs. Neely Hudson and Mrs. 
Dick Eichelberger attended the 
funeral of Mrs. Murff of Brice 
Wednesday of last week.

Mrs. Dave Speir and Mrs. Con­
nie Taylor of Hedley visited with 
Mrs. Roy Stewart Friday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Brock, Mr. 
and Mrs. Higdon and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Doc Ford and sons 
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Littlefield.

Mr. and Mrs. C. L. Pierce of 
Memphis spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Buck Parker and family.

H. C. Smith returned home a 
few days ago after spending a few 
months in California visiting rela­
tives and working. He spent a few 
weeks in Arizona before returning 
home.

Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Small from 
Amarillo visited with Mrs. L. E.
Vinson over the weekend

Claude Vinson, wife and son 
visited Mrs. L. E. Vinson over the 
week end.

HAY FEVER SDJUS 
a n d . CATARRH

TO CHECK

vjM t«jk 6 6 6
W Liquid for Malarial Symptoaw.

Easy to apply. Quick to act. 
Stopa “pink eye" low . A 3-gram 
battle—enough to treat 10 to to

a JS h iU in a A ^  i
Calf Proscription 

For the treatment of dietary 
diarrhea. A time tested formula. 
Oats the Job done. Large bottle ■
4* 00.

. Jbdb&yd.
S u l f a  P o w d a r

A sulfa drug preparation for 
anigal wounds. Promotes prompt 
healing. Convenient shaker can— 
1% ounces >1.00.
g trih lings' Animal Health Pro­
ducts are made by practical cat­
tle people, tested In their own 
herd, and guaranteed to gat the
Jab dona In yours. Wa are proud 
to bo the exclusive agency in 
our town for this line of out- 

•* tending original products. Drop, 
la any time and let us show 
them to you and explain their

Drug Co.

J M I D W A Y  J
♦ Mr*. John Goldston ♦
♦ ♦

Cpl. H. L. Riley visited in the 
W. K. Davis home.

Mrs. Dan Keller and son Dan Jo 
moved back to her apartment at 
the Lands in Clarendon Monday. 
She had beeh with her parents 
since returning from the hospital.

Roy Davis of Marion is visiting 
his parents the W. K. Davis’ this 
week.

Charles Stidham and Jack 
Jachman spent Monday night in 
the Davis home.

Pvt. and Mrs. Bud Hermes- 
meyer and young son are here 
visiting relatives. They are from 
Florida.

Freddy Goldston spent the past 
week with Vernon Goldston.

Misses Virginia, Jane and Mary 
Ellen Williams were home this 
past week to be with their brother 
Lt. Joe Williams who was home 
on a furlough.

Betty John Goldston of Ama­
rillo spent Sunday, and Monday 
with her parents.

Pfc. John Hunsburger from the 
A-A.F. in Kingman, Ariz. was a 
guest in the John Goldsion home 
Sunday and Monday.

Mrs. Edith Longan returned 
Monday from Dallas where she 
had visited with Mrs. Harley 
Longan.

Mrs. Harold Longan received 
word Sunday her husband was in 
a hospital.

Johnny Chamberlain spent part 
of the past week with his grand 
mother Chamberlain.

J. A. WARREN
AGENCY

INSURANCE •  BONDS

NOTARY PUBLIC

COMPLETE INCOME TAX 
S E R V I C E  

(29 yean’ experience)

Social Security k Withholding 
Tax Reports

FREE CONSULTATION
Offices: Goldston Building, 

Clarendon, Texas

Harold Usrey of the U. S. Navy 
pnd stationed at Camp Wallace, 
left Monday after spending the 
week with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. O. L. Usrey.

Miss Edna Wood, who has been 
visiting in San .Diego, Calif., re­
turned home Saturday.

Miss Moody Aten left Thursday 
to visit her sister, Mrs. Glenn 
Rudder of Hereford.

Mrs. Blanche Tomlinson and 
daughter Dorothy of Dallas visited 
relatives and friends last week.

Floyd Lewis returned to his 
naval bEise at Seattle, Washington 
Sunday after visiting in the home 
of his pau'ents, Mr. and Mrs. C. L. 
Lewis.

Mr. and Mrs. D. E. Leathers 
visited in Memphis last Thursday.

June Meredith of Memphis 
came Saturday to visit with Shir­
ley Aten.

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Scott of 
Oklahoma City spent several days 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Char­
lie Young.

J. H. Wood, Mrs. Inez Roberson 
and Doris and Miss Edna Wood

visited relatives in Quail Sunday.
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Crutchfield 

and family of Clarendon spent 
Sunday with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. O. L. Usrey.

Quinn Aten returned home 
Thursday from working in Vega.

Mrs. Lanelle Lovelady of Ama­
rillo visited in the home of her 
parents, Mr. -nd Mrs. C. L. Lewis 
over the week end.

Lavem Usrey^ is at home now 
after attending summer school at 
Canyon.

Mrs. Quinn Aten and Shirley, 
Mrs. Sam Roberts and Mrs. Rice 
Batson went to Amarillo Thurs.

Mrs. Charlie Young left Sunday 
to visit her sister, who lives in 
Oklahoma City.

Donley County Leader. 92 a year.
DON'T PLUSH KIDNEYS

To stop pain, burning, frequent 
desire to urinate use CIT-ROS. 
The new remedy quickly re­
stores the normal ph. of the body 
fluids. The cause is eliminated, 
the body stops pain, heals sore 
spots. CIT-ROS brings you com­
forting relief. CIT-ROS at your 
druggist $1.00. For sale at

Douglas k Goldston Drug Co.
(26-p)

ABSTRACTS •  LOANS 
and REAL ESTATE

Donley County Abstract Company
C. E. KILLOUGH

Phona 44

1

FEED OF ALL KINDS
Grain, thrashed Kaffir, Maisa. Wheat. Ooats and 

Barley, chopped Barley. Milo. Wheat or Ooats.
SWEET COW FEED—19% or 9% Protein 

WHEAT BRAN and SHORTS
Plenty of that good. Chic-O-Line, Growing Mash, 

Egg Mash and Egg Mash pellets. The 20% Protein Mash 
with Yallow Corn—The feed that dallyers the goods.

BUY YOUR COAL NOW, WHILE IT CAN BE HAD

Simpsons Mill & Feed Store
P h o n e  14B

/ .  - \

t / o / A / e t / t f 's

Douglas-Goldston 
Drug Co.

THE REXALL STORE 
P hono 36

m m i m i

700////
B efore THIS WAR IS OVER, there may be only two kinds of
people in America

1. these who can still get to work in automobiles,
2. these who ace forced to walk.

B otect your car a t 3 9  danger p o in ts/

GULF’S Protective Maintenance Plan 
includes Oulflex Registered Lubrication 
which reaches up to 39 vital points with 
six dittaren t Oulflex Lubricants that re­
duce wear, and lengthen your car’s life.

Sane M ass bearings andpiston rin g s/

IT’S IMPORTANT to give your car a 
good motor oil and change regularly. Gulf 
offers two outstanding oils . , .  Oulfpride, 
“The World’s Finest Motor Oil,” and 
Oul.lube, an extra-quality oil costing a 
few cent* lr«*.

If you want to be in the fortu­
nate group who will still be 
riding to work in automobiles, 
join Gulfs "Anti-Breakdown” 
Club today. How do you do it? 
Just come in for G ulf  a Pro­

tective Maintenance Planf 
This plan was conceived by 

experts in car care.
Gulf developed it because car 

maintenance is a most impor­
tant civilian job.

Strotcb g a s coupons/

AXR-FILTERand spark-plugclean­
ing, and radiator flushing help give 
better gst mileage. A clean air filter 
makes gas bum more economically; 
clean plugs increase power; a clean 
radiator prevents overheating.

G et an appoin tm en t a t yo a r

fa //S ta tio n . .

%
To HELP YOUR Gulf Dealer do a 
thorough Job on your car—and to 
save your time— make an appoint­
ment In advance. Phone or speak 
to him at the etatlon. Then you 
should encounter no delay when 
you get Gulf* Protective Mainte­
nance Plan . . .  15 services In all!

...fir  battier car care tadtuf 
tb arout bmbriomts tmarrmi
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HOUSE JOINT RESOLUTION 
proponing: an amendment to Section 61 of 
Article 6 of the Constitution of the State 
of Texas, by addins thereto Sections 61-e 
and 51-f; Section 61-e providing that cities 
and towns in this State shall have the 
power and authority to provide a system of 
retirement and disability pensions for its 
employees, provided, however, that no pen- 
skm system shall be set up in any city un­
til H has been approved at an election by 
qualified voters entitled to vote St an elec­
tion on the question of the issuance of tax 
supported bonds; Section 6l-f providing 
that the Legislature shall have authority to 
provide a system of retirement and disabil­
ity pensions for appointive officers and em­
ployees of citiss and towns to operate State­
wide or by districts under such plan or 
program as the Legislature shall direct and 
ahall provide that participation therein by 
cities and towns shall be voluntary; pro­
vided that the Legislature shall never make 
an appropriation to pay any of the cost of 
any system authorised by this Section ; pro­
viding for an election on the question of 
the adoption or rejection of such an amend­
ment and making an appropriation there­
for; providing for the proclamation and 
publication therefor and prescribing the 
form of ballot.

BE IT RE80LVED BY THE LEGISLA­
TURE OP THE STATE OP TEXAS:

Section 1. That Section 61 of Article I of 
the Constitution of the State of Texas be 
amended by adding thereto Sections 61-e 
and 61-f, which shall read as follows:

“Section 61-e. Each Incorporated city and

town in this State shall have the power and 
authority to provide a system of retirement 
and disability pensions for Its appointive 
officers and employees who have become 
disabled mm a direct and proximate result of 
the performance of their duties, or have 
passed their sixty-fifth birthday, or have 
been employed by such city or town for 
more than twenty-five (26) years and have 
passed their sixtieth birthday, when and if, 
but only when and if, such system has been 
approved at an election by the qualified 
voters of sach city or town entitled to vote 
an the question of issuance of tax support­
ed bonds; provided that no city or town 
shall contribute more than the equivalent 
of seven and one half (7%) per centum of 
salaries and wages of the officers and em­
ployees entitled to participate in its pension 
system, and that said officers and em­
ployees shall contribute a like amount; and 
this Amendment shall not reduce the au­
thority nor duty of any city or town other­
wise existing.

“Section Slf. The Legislature of this 
State shall have the authority to provide 
for a system of retirement and disability 
pensions for appointive officers and em­
ployees of cities and towns to operate State­
wide or by districts under such a plan and 
program as the Legislature shall direct and 
shall provide that participation therein by 
cities and towns shall be voluntary; pro­
vided that the Legislature shall never make 
an appropriation to pay any of the cost of 
any system authorize*, by this Section.”

Sec. t . The foregoing Constitutional 
Amendments ahall be submitted to a vote 
of the qualified electors of this State at an 
election to be held throughout the State in

INSURANCE
FIRE •  TORNADO g  HAIL g  AUTO

AND ALL KINDRED LINES

BONDS g  NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
C. C. PowellP b o n *  11 l - l

A Weapon at Home - - •
B A N K  C R E D I T
The loans of this bank are helping to 
maintain a strong “Home Front”. We

e

are cooperating with farmers, busi­
ness firms and individuals, to supply 
funds for the legitimate needs of this 
community. We shall welcome aji 
opportunity to serve you in any prop­
er banking capacity. Come in for a 
confidential discussion.

BUY MORE WAR BONDS AND KEEP THEMl

First National Bank
Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

November. 1944. at which all ballots shall 
have printed thereon, “For the Constitu­
tional Amendment providing that the citiee 
and towns in this State shall have the 
power and authority to provide a system of 
pensions for their appointive officers and 
employees.” and "Against the Constitution­
al Amendment providing that all chics and 
towns in this State shall have the power 
and authority to provide a system of pen­
sions for their appointive officers and em­
ployees.” All ballots at such election shall 
also have printed thereon, “For the Con­
stitutional Amendment giving authority to 
the Legislature to provide for a system of 
retirement and disability pensions for ap­
pointive officers snd employees of the cities 
and towns” and “Against the Constitution­
al Amendment giving authority to the 
Legislature to provide for a system of re­
tirement and disability pensions for ap­
pointive officers and employees of cities 
and towns.” Eaoh voter shall scratch out 
two (2) of said clauses on the ballot, leav­
ing the two (2) expressing his vote on the 
proposed Amendments.

8e«. 2. The Governor of the 8tste of 
Texas shall Issue the necessary proclama­
tion for said election snd shall have the 
same published as required by the Constitu­
tion for Amendments thereto.

See. 4. The sum of Five Thousand Dol­
lars (96.000). or so much thereof as may be 
necessaor, is hereby appropriated out of 
any funds in the Treasury of the State, not 
otherwise rppropriated. to pay the ex­
penses of such publication and election.

(27-«)

B. J. R. Ne. 16 
HOUSE JOINT RESOLUTION 

proposing an Amendment to Section 9 of 
Article 8 of the Constitution of the 8tate 
of Texas, by changing said Section 9 so as 
to provide that the Commissioners Court in 
any county may reallocate the county tax 
levies authorised In said sgetion by chang­
ing the rates provided for any of the same, 
but in no event shall the total of such taxes 
exceed eighty (80) cents on the one hund­
red dollars valuation for any one year; 
providing that before such Commissioners 
Court may make such re-allocations and 
changes In such levies that the same shall 
be submitted to the qualified property tax 
paying voters of such county at a general 
or special election and shall be approved by 
a majority of the qualified property tax 
paying voters, voting in such election ; pro­
viding that if and when such re-ellocstkms 
and changes in such county tax levies have 
been approved by the qualified property tax 
paying voters of any county as herein pro­
vided, such re-allocations and changes shall 
remain in force and effect for e period of 
six (6) years from the date of the election 
at which same shall be approved, unless 
the same again shall have been changed by 
a majority vote of the qualified property 
tax paying voters of such county, voting on 
the proposition, after submission by the 
Commissioners Court at a general or spec­
ial election for thst purpose; providing tha£ 
this section shall not U  construed sa a 
limitation on powers delegated to counties, 
cities or towns by any other section or sec­
tions of this Construction ; fixing the time 
for the election for the adoption or rejec­
tion of said proposed Constitutoinal Amend­
ment ; making certain provisions for said 
election and ballots thereof and the method 
thereof; directing the issuance of procla­
mation therefor ; prescribing certain duties 
of the Governor of the State of Texas; and 
making an appropriation to defray the ex­
penses of said election.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE LEGISLA­
TURE OF THE STATE OF TEXAS:

Wanted! Men and 
Women Who Are 
Hard of Hearing

To moko tbia sim ple, no rink boaring <
I f  yon oro U m pororily deafened, both 
by ringing b o n in g  hood nolaoo duo to b a ld ­
ened or coagulated w az (een u n en ), t ry  th e  
O orine Home Method toot th a t  ae many aay 
baa enabWd th a n  to  bear wall again. Yoo 
m ust hear b e tte r  a f te r  m aking th is aim pie 
tea t o r  yob g e t your money back a t  
Aek about O uriaa “  ~

Douglas k Goldaton Drug Co.

DR. H. R. BECK
D E N T I S T

Phone 44

8 to 12—Office hour*—1 to 8 

Goldcton Bids 

Clarendon. Texas

i im i im m n m u p i

Section 1. Thst Section 9 of Article 8 of 
the Constitution of the State of Texas, be 
so amended that the same will hereafter 
read as follows t

"Section 9. The State tax on property, 
exclusive of the tax necessary to pay the 
public debt, and of the taxes provided for 
the benefit of the public free schools, shall 
never exceed thirty-five (86) cents on the 
one hundred dollars valuation; and no 
county, city or town shall levy more than 
twenty-five (26) cents for city or county 
purposes, and not exceeding fifteen (16) 
cents for roads and bridges, and not ex­
ceeding fifteen (16) cents to pay jurors, on 
the one hundred dollars valuation, except 
for the payment of debts incurred prior to 
-the adoption, of the Amendment September 
26, 1888; and for the erection of public 
buildings, streets, sewers, waterworks and 
other permanent improvements, not to ex­
ceed twenty-five (26) cents on the one 
hundred dollars valuation, in any one yeer, 
and except as is in this Constitution other­
wise provided ; provided, however, that the 
Commissioners Court in any county may 
re-allocate the foregoing county taxes by 
changing the rates provided for any of the 
foregoing purposes by either increasing or 
decreasing the same, but in no event shall 
the total of said foregoing county taxes 
exce4>d eighty (80) cents on the one hund­
red dollars valuation, in any one year; 
provided further, that before the said Com­
missioners Court may make such re-alloca­
tions and changes in said county taxes that 
the same shall be submitted to the qualified 
property fax paying voters of such county 
at a general or special election, and shall 
be approved by a majority of the qualified 
property tax paying voters, voting in such 
election ; and, provided further, that if and 
when such re-allocations and changes in 
the aforesaid county taxes have been ap­
proved by the qualified property tax pay­
ing voters of any county, as herein pro­
vided, such re-allocations and changes shall 
remain in force and effect for a period of 
six (9) years from the date of the election 
at which the same shall be approved, un­
less the same again shall have been changed 
by a majorit) vote of the qualified property 
tax paying voters of such county, voting on 
the proposition, after submission by the 
Commissioners Court at a general or special 
election for that purpose; and the Legisla­
ture may also authorise an additional an­
nual ad valorem tax to be levied and col­
lected for the further maintenance of tht 
public roads; provided, that a majoriy of 
the qualified property tax paying voters of 
the county voting at an election to be held 
for that purpose shall vote such tax, not to 
exceed fifteen (16) cents on the one hund­
red dollars valuation of the property sub­
ject to taxation In such county. And the 
Legislature may pass local laws for the 
maintenance of the public roads und high­
ways, without the Ideal notice required for 
special or local laws. This section shall nm 
be construed as a limitation of power dele­
gated to counties, cities or towns by any 
other section or sections of this Constitu­
tion.”

Sec. 2. The foregoing Constitutional 
Amendment shall be submitted to a vote of 
the qualified eieciors of this State at a 
general election to be held throughout the 
State of Texas on the seventh day of No­
vember, 1944, at which election all voters 
favoring the proposed Amendment shall 
write or have printini on their ballots the 
following words:

“For the Amendment to Section 9 of 
Article 8 of the Constitution of the State 
of Texas, so as to provide thst the Com­
missioners Court in any county may »*■ 
allocate the county tax levies authorised in 
said section by changing, the rate* provided 
for any of the purposes authorised in said 
section by either increasing or decreasing 
the same, but in no event shall the total of 
such taxes exc<M>d eighty (80) cents on the 
one hundred dollars valuation for any one 
year; providing that before such Commis­
sioners Court may make such re-allocation* 
and changes in such I n in  that the same 
shall be submitted to the qualified property 
tax paying voters of such county at a gen­
eral or special election and shall be ap­
proved by a majority of the qualified prop­
erty tax paying voters, voting in such e le c ­
tions ; providing that if and when such re­
allocations and changes in such county tax 
levies have been approved by the qualified 
property tax paying voters of any county 
as herein provided, such re-allocations and 
changes shall remain In force and effect 
for a period of six (•) years from the date 
of the election at which same shall be ap­
proved, unless the name shall have been chans«Kl by s majority vote of the qualified property Ur pay Ins vVter« of .uch muMv. 
voting on the proposition, after submission 
by the Commissioners Court at a general 
or special election for that purpoec; and 
providing that this Amendment shall not 
be construed as a limitation on powers dele­
gated to counties, cities or towns by any 
other section or sections of the Constitu­
tion.”

These opposing said proposed Amendment 
shall write or have printed on their ballots 
the following words:

“Against the Amendment to Section 9 of 
Article 8 of the Constitution of the State 
of Texasi so as to provide that the Com­
missioners Court In any county may re­
allocate the county tax levies authorised in 
said section by changing the rates provided 
for any of the purposes authorised in said 
section by either increasing or decreasing 
the same, but In no event shall the total of 
such taxes exceed eighty (80) cents on the 
one hundred dollars valuation for any one 
year; providing that before such Com- 
mlssionem Court may make such re-alloca-

tions and changes in such levies thst the 
same shall be submitted to the qualified 
property tax paying voters of such county 
at a general or special election and shall 
be approved by a majority of the qualified 
property tax paying voters, voting in such 
election ; providing that if and when such 
re-allocations and changes in such county 
tax levies have been approved by the quali­
fied property tax paying voters of any 
county as herein provided, such re-alloca- 
tions and changes shall remain in force 
and effect for a jw*ri«»d of six (6) years 
from the date of election at which snme 
shall be approved, unices the same shall 
have been changed by a majority vote of 
the qualified property tax paying voters of 
such county, voting on the propoeition, af­
ter submission by the Commissioners Court 
at a general or special election for that 
purpose; and providing that this Amend­
ment shall not be construed as a limitation 
on powers delegated to countiee, cities or 
towns by any other section or sections of 
the Constitution.”

If it appears from the returns of said 
election that a majority of the votes cast 
are in favor of said Amendment, the same 
shall become a part of the 8tate Constitu­
tion.

Sec. 8. The Governor of the State of 
Texas shall issue the necessary proclama­
tion for said election, and shall have the 
same publishiri a* required by the Con­
stitution and Laws of this State.

Sec. 4. The sum of Five Thousand Dol­
lars (86,000), or so much thereof as may be 
necessary, is hereby appropriate out of any 
funds in the Treasury of the State, not 
otherwise appropriated, to pay the expenses 
of such publication and election.

(27-c)
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Mr. and Mrs. C. G, Knox visited 
their son, Van Knox and family 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Poovey are 
visiting relatives at Pampa and 
Borger this week.

W. E. Allen and daughter, Mrs. 
Ruth Fowler of Lubbock visited 
relatives here over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Joyner had 
business in Amarillo Saturday.

Mrs. Lizzie Gargas and her 
mother Mrs. Burt were Welling­
ton visitors Wednesday and 
Thursday.

Ruth Nelson was an Amarillo 
visitor on Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Joyner ac­
companied by Mrs. Jess Nelson

left Monday for Dallas and 
Clarksville for a two weeks visit 
with relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Hugh Knox of 
Vega visited friends and relatives 
here Sunday. They were accompa­
nied by Alice Hicks also of Vega.

Mary Lou Barker of Friona was 
a guest of Jane Wilson Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. H. W. Lovell, Joe 
and James Lovell, Mrs. Dollie 
White and L. P. and John White 
and family visited Andrew Bar­
rett of Amarillo the past week. 
Andrew is a patient in Northwest 
Texas Hospital and is in a critical 
condition.

Katherine and Jane Lovell of 
Dallas and S. H. Lovell of Mc­
Kinney have been visiting rela­
tives here.

Mrs. Charlie Harp and Meryl 
Thompsdh had business in Ama­
rillo Monday.

Mrs. Ben Scoggins returned 
home on Wednesday after an ex­
tended visit with her mother in 
Oklahoma.

Mrs. Henry Wilson was an 
Amarillo visitor Monday.

Mrs. Marti Mason of I^velland 
is here visiting her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dick Tomlinson.

Mrs. John Dial of Channing is 
a guest in the W. A. Poovey home.

D. F. Randel had business in 
Amarillo Monday.

Van Knox and family spent 
Sunday with his parents at Lelia 
Lake.

Mrs. Howard Franklin and chil­
dren of Clarendon spent a few 
days in the home of her mother, 
Mrs. Lizzie Gargis this week.

Neal Cearley of Amarillo is a 
guest of his grandmother, Mrs. 
Watt Hardin.

Mr. and Mrs. Noel Knox of Mel­
rose, N. M. visited in the Van 
Knox home Saturday.

The following boys left Sunday

morning for a trip to New Mexico, 
Carlsbad Cavern and other points 
of interest: Henry Wilson Jr., Bob­
bie Brown, Joe Lovell, James 
Lovell, Herschel Brinson, Gene 
White, Billie Ray Reid, Ray Mor­
ris, Royce Morris, Ted Tomlinson 
and C. M. Hudson Jr. of Good­
night.

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
Martin Common School District 

No. 18, of Donley County, Texas, 
will accept bids for the construc­
tion of a one story brick and tile 
school building for said district. 
Bids must be received at the office 
of the Ceunty Superintendent of 
Donley County, Clarendon, Texas, 
not later than 10:00 o’clock A. M. 
Saturday, August 26, 1944, at
which time bids will be opened. 
Plans and Specifications may be 
secured at the office of the County 
Superintendent and the owner re­
serves the right to reject any or 
all bids. (26-2c)

Mrs. J. B. Davis of Amarillo is 
visiting her mother, Mrs. Laura 
Silver.

Cpl. Doyle Martin, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Chester Martin is now in 
training school at Barksdale, La.

Willys
W  fo u r in  o n eJeep

U Light Truck 
r Puttenger  Cor 
1 Light Tractor 

Power Plant

Have a “Coke” =Welcome back

5 . .  .o r  giving a  returned soldier a  taste o f home
T o  soldiers overseas, Coca-Cola is  a reminder o f  hom e. T o  soldiers at hom e 
on  furlough, “Coke” is p an  o f the o ld  familiar way o f living. W ith frosty bottles 
o f  “Coke” on hand, offering a man in uniform a refreshing w elcom e is an 
easy matter. Have a "Coke" is  always the hospitable thing to say. In many lands 
overseas, as in your ow n living room , Coca-Cola su n d s for the pause that 
refreshes,—hot becom e a happy sym bol o f  hospitality.

60TTIED UNDER AUTHORITY O f  THE COCA-COLA COMPANY RY

MEMPHIS C O C A - C O L A  BOTTLING COMPANY

“ C ok e” =  Coca-C ola
It’s natural for popular names 
to acquire friendly abbrevia- 

| tions. That’s why you hear 
Coca-Cola called ‘‘Coke” .

_ _ C  1*44 Tlw C-C Cfc.

W A L L PA PE R
Make your selection from our beautiful line of OVER 
200 PATTERNS, displayed on MODERN PANELS 
that shows Wall, Ceiling and Border as it will appear 
in your Home.
TA K E A D V A N T A G E  OF OUR EVER EX TR EM ELY  LOW  PR IC E S A N D  
REFINISH YOUR ENTIRE HOM E NOW BEFO RE THE FA L L  R U SH .

P A I N T
The LARGEST STOCK of FINE QUALITY PAINTS, 
VARNISHES AND ENAMELS IN THIS ENTIRE 
AREA.
A  thorough understanding of th e  m any d ifferen t m ateria ls to  be used  on th e  
various P A IN T IN G . PA PE R IN G  & DECO RATING  Jobs can sa v e  you  
M A N Y  D O LLA R S.

Let our many years of experience in the Paint & Wall­
paper business help you avoid expensive mistakes.

M ay w e  help  you  SAVE on your P ain ting. P apering  & D ecorating?

B esid es FLO R M A N S FINE LIN E OF H IG H  Q U A LITY  M A TER IA LS that 
have proved  th em selves in  59 years of D U R A B L E  SERVICE w e  have a 
com p lete  LINE of the fo llo w in g  SPE C IA L S.

V A L SP A R  V A R N ISH E S, KEM TONE. STACO TE. W ALRITE. FELT. 
W A LTEX . OILCLOTH. G LA SS. AUTO  G L A SS. M IRRORS. PIC TU R ES. 
V A SE S. B R U SH E S. PA IN T E R S SU P P L IE S A N D  M ANY OTHER ITEM S.

IDEAL Built in C A B I N E T S
Put Together, ready to Place in Your Kitchen 

NEW and USED FURNITURE

SAVE AT THE.
P A IN T
HUDSON

Phone 82-M
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P A U i n o n . -THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADEN-

R ED  C R O S ^
VOLUNTEER SERVICE

Mi-s. D. F. Wadsworth took out 
12 Navy Kits to muke, Mrs. J. C. 
Estlack 6, Mrs. Pete Borden 6. 

The Ashtola Community turned

in 79 completed kits made by the 
following ladies of that commun­
ity: Mrs. Van Knox, Mrs. Hubert 
Rhodes, Mrs. Marie Miller, Mrs. J. 
M. Graham, Mrs. R. O. Slater. Mrs. 
H. S. Mahaffey, Mrs. M. R. Word, 
Mrs. Joe Bownds. Mrs. W. A. 
Poovey, Mrs. Leo Wallace, Mrs. 
H. N. Henderson, Mrs. J. R. Bran­
don, Mrs. M. S. Swinbum, Mrs.

POWDERED SUGAR
POUND ..................................................................

8c
SHORTENING
MRS. TUCKERS— 3 LBS............. ........... .. 63c
PEANUT BUTTER
24 0 Z .J A R .........................................................

29c
FRUIT JARS

Quarts— Dos.. 69c
JAR LIDS
KERRS—DOZ.....................................  .............. 10c
CORN FLAKES
M IL L E R S-B O X ................................................

5c
SUGAR
10 LBS.................................................................... 65c
FLY SPRAY
ALL KINDS— QUART ........................................ 35c
ONIONS
YELLOW—P O U N D ............................................. 7c
MILK
PET OR CARNATION— 2 TALL C A N S ......... 19c
VINEGAR
Wide Mouth GALLON J A R ................................... 39c
STOCK SPRAY
SINCLAIR—G A L L O N ......................................... 79c
FL O U R
GOLD MEDAL— 25 LBS....................................

$ 1 2 5

HAMBURGER
ALL MEAT— POUND 23c
PRINCE ALBERT
FOR ........................................................................ 10c
BOLOGNA
POUND 29c
STEAK
FOREQUARTER— POUND 28 c

D. W. Tomlinson, Mrs. C. G. 
Cobbs, Mrs. Austin Rhodes, Mrs. 
Jeff Nelson. Mrs. Ella Beggs, Mrs. 
Mary Myers, Mrs. M. H. Rhoades, 
Mrs. Ross Springer, and Mrs. P. 
A. Nelson. Sr.

Mrs. W. C. Bridges, Chairman of 
the Hedley Red Cross work, turn­
ed in the following articles made 
by the ladies of the Hedley Com­
munity: 24 men’s bathrobes, 36 
bedjackets, 37 bedside pockets, 33 
pillow tops, 31 card table covers, 
81 bed pan covers, 24 pairs of 
pillow cases, 9 sheets, 13 quilts, 1 
afagan, and a box of used cloth­
ing.

We want to thank Mrs. M. H. 
Rhoades for fixing all the Red 
Cross labels on the garments.

Also, we would like to thank 
Mrs. Leona Jones for the fruit jars 
she donated to the Emergency 
Chest.

HOME SERVICE
Mrs. C. A. Burton

A contest open to present or 
discharged members of the armed 
forces of the U. S. and our Allies 
was announced recently by Ran­
dom House. They offer $2,300 for 
the best book either fiction or 
nonfiction, on the return and re­
adjustment of servicemen to civil­
ian life. The closing date of the 
contest is May 31, 1945

The Administrator of Veterans 
Affairs is authorized to guarantee 
loans obtained by veterans for the 
purchase, construction or altera­
tion of homes, farms or business 
property, or for the equipment of 
farms or business. The guarantee 
is limited to a maximum of $2,000 
and cannot exceed 50% of the 
loan. It may be made on loans ob­
tained from persons, firms, as­
sociations, corporations, or gov­
ernment agencies, either state or 
federal. This loan benefit will 
terminate five years after the end 
of the war.

The Serviceman’s Readjustment 
Act of 1944, which became effect­
ive in June, provides federal gov­
ernment aid for readjustment in 
civilian life for returning World 
War II veterans. New benefits are 
provided for education, loans and 
unemployment. Especially liberal 
are the provisions for education 
and vocational rehabilitation.

The necessity for full identify­
ing information when seeking in­
formation can be understood 
when we realize that the index of 
servicemen now includes more 
than nineteen million names. 
There are more than 200,000 
Smiths and about 12,000 of these 

John Smiths, There

MEMORIAL FUND 
FINANCIAL STATEMENT 

TO DATE

Quota
Amount

Paid
Clarendon $1500.00 $1266.50
Midway 30.00 55.50
Chamberlain . . 100.00 73.50
Je richo ......... 65.00 38.50
Bairfield 50.00 45.50
H udgins....... 85.00 21.50
Lelia Lake ... 200.00 211.56
Sunnyview ... . 100.00 83 50
Glenwood . . . . 30.00 14.00
Fairview . . . . 60.00 42.50
Windy Valley . 100.00 30.05
M artin ........... . 175.00 239.90
Ashtola ....... 195.00 135.83
Goldston....... 105.00 79.00
Skillet .......... 65.00 20.00
Hedley . 525.00 275.40
Giles 70.00 82.00
White Fish 50.00 61.50
Smith School 50.00 • 30.00
Watkins 15.00
B ra y ........ 70.00 37.00
McKnight .. 100.00 91.00

Browns. More than 92,000 have 
the surname Williams and 88,000 
the surname Jones. Because of the 
many similarities of names, much 
information which seems non-es­
sential is sometimes called for. 
But in spite of all these difficul­
ties, the Red Cross Field Directors 
and the military men do a won­
derful job in locating a man when 
necessary, as I had proof of during 
the past week.

Van Allen Kent has gone to 
Amarillo to work for the Ft. 
Worth & Denver railroad.

Mr. and Mrs. Fayne Kent of 
Phillips have returned home after 
a few days visit here with rela­
tives.

Keep Your Car Fit —
i
BY BRINGING IT TO US REGULARLY FOR FIRST CLASS - HIGH QUALITY

Wash and Lubrication Service
Proper cart now will giva your car a better chance to last for the duration and give you 
good aervice at the same time. *

WE FIX FLATS — BATTERIES —  BAiTERY SERVICE

DAVIS Bumper to Bumper Service

Total___  $3740.00 $2930.24

Mrs. Phelan of Memphis is 
visiting her daughter, Mrs. Carl 
Allmond this week.

Mrs. Frank White Jr. and son 
Frank III are visiting her mother 
and sister at Amarillo this week.

Mrs. Mary Dollarhide of Dallas 
is visiting her sister, Mrs. Monica 
Harvey.

Mrs. Rayburn Smith returned 
home Sat. from West Point where 
she had visited her son, Ray 
bum Smith Jr.

Miss Lela Clifford lett Monday 
for Colorado on a two weeks vaca­
tion trip before her school begins.

Skinny Putman 
Writes Homefolks 
From Hawaii

The following letter was receiv­
ed recently by Mr. and Mrs. M. L. 
Putman from their son Skinny, 
describing a part of the Hawaiian 
Islands where he is now located. 
Dear Folks:

Just a few lines to let you know 
I am well and doing fine. Hope 
everyone there is the same. I am 
having a swell time at present as 1 
am on a five day pass, and took a 
plane to the big Island. It is the 
highest Island in the Hawaiians. 
The name of it is Hawaii. “The 
Garden Island” is what th$y call 
it. It is really a beautiful island, 
everything is to green. I think it 
stays that way all year around.

Two more boys and myself are 
here together. We are staying in 
the town of Hilo. It’s a nice quiet 
town, almoat too quiet Ha. It 
hardly seems right. I have been 
used to a lot of noise.

We stayed last night at a rest 
camp. It is for service men on 
leave. They have horse back rid­
ing, bicycle riding and several 
other sports one can play. It is a 
nice place to rest. If one likes 
quiet and peace. We saw a vol­
cano from a distance. It covers a 
lot of ground in spots. Some large, 
some small. I am sending some 
post cards of it. There is one vol­
cano on this island that is one of 
the seven wonders of the world. I 
haven’t seen it yet. I may and I 
may not. I am at one of the USO’s 
now. It is still light out side and 

Is eight o'clock or after, which 
means it is kbowt ten thirty there 
or eleven. 1 guess I'll have a stack

Meeting Called . 
August 23rd For 
Essential Workers

Representatives of the United 
States Employment will be at the 
County Agent’s office in Claren­
don from 9 to 12-noon on Wednes­
day, August 23 to discuss job 
openings in essential industry.

Individuals interested in tem­
porary employment can be used, 
and may return to farm work 
when needed. No release is neces­
sary to return to farm jobs.

These representatives are es­
pecially interested in talking with 
any veterans interested and need­
ing employment at this time.

High priority jobs will be dis­
cussed with all interested appli­
cants, and anyone wanting any in­
formation about job openings for 
both men and women should feel 
free in asking about such informa­
tion.

______Thursday, August 17. 1944
LIONS CLUB PROGRAM i 
LEADERS THROUGH 
SEPTEMBER 5

The leaders of the program for 
the Lions Club through Septem­
ber 5 th:

August 8th—Carl Bennett 
August 15th—Gordon Bain: The 

Panama Canal.
August 22nd—W. D. Kidd 
August 29th—G. T. Palmer 
Sept. 5th—P. E. Yarborough.

of mail when I get back. I had 
four letters when I left, but didn’t 
get to answer them. I don’t know 
what all we will see before we go 
back to Oahu or to camp. You can 
let all the kids read this as I don't 
imagine I will write any more 
while I am over here. Well, I don’t 
know any thing else to write so 
I will sign off for this time. So 
write with lots of news. Aloha 
from Hilo Hawaii. Lots of love, 
Skinny. P. S. Tell all hello for me.

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Bones and 
children visited in Amarillo Sun.

Mrs. Lalar Wiikerson and dau­
ghter Margaret of Canadian visit­
ed friends in Clarendon Friday.

Mrs. Shackelford has returned 
to her home at Canyon after a 
visit with her daughter, Mrs. 
Homer Bones last week.

Mrs. Cal Merchant and Ger­
trude Boles were Amarillo visitors 
Tuesday. ,

Lavoise Armstrong spent the 
week end in Amarillo visiting 
relatives.

Thyra Haley from 
speht the week end visiting 
mother, Mrs. Haley here.

Amarillo
I

her

Mr .and Mrs. Warren Lott left 
Wednesday for their home in 
Shreveport, La., after a visit with 
relatives and friends here and in 
Amarillo.

Dr. Keith S. Lowell
GENERAL PRACTICE 

AND SURGERY

Offices in Goldston Bldg. 
Offics Phone 126 

Residence Phone 174

ICE CREAM POWDER, E-Z-Box

AT

M
S Y S T E M

and
S A V E

DALE HILL, Manager

’ f  Y, NICE

L E T T U C E
HEAD

10c
FRESH

CARROTS
BUNCH

6c
WHITE SWEET

O N I O N S
POUND

8c
CALIFORNIA

LEMONS
DOZEN

29c

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 
THE AMOUNT OF ANY ITEM

FLOUR
GREAT WEST— 70 LBS.

SHORTENING
BIRD BRAND—4 LBS...........

CRACKERS
SALTED—POUND BOX

51c
69c
15c

PEANUT BUTTER
WAPCO—QUART ........................ ..............

i

45d
MILK
White Swan—3 Tall Cans 25c SALT JOWLS

Pound 15c
O RANGES
California—Pound . .’y.\. . . . . . . 11c COUNTRY EGGS

Froeh—Dosen.........■ 31c
CUT BEANS
Wapco Brand—No. 2 Can 14c LUNCH MEATS

Assorted—Pound 30c
CORNFLAKES
WHITE SWAN— 7 7 OZ. PKG.

‘ I 8c
PINTO BEANS
U. S. No. 1 Recleaned—POUND 10c
SPUDS
U. S. No. 1— 70 LBS........... . 43c

M E  H l R t

STEAK 
Pound ..

WE HAVE HOME KILLED BEEF AND PORK

:.... :..... i S i
ROAST
Pound ..

LIVER 
Freeh—Pound

SLICED BACON
Fancy Grade A—Pound 38c
GROUND BEEF
Pound....... .......... 25c
PORK SAUSAGE
Pound .................... 29c


