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Stf'X-
- . . . . State Teenage Beauty Pageant 

to Unfold Here This Weekend

a ll o f Clarendon College will be on hand Friday evening at the Clarendon Country Club to nuke the parents o f girls 
participating in the Miss Texas Teen-Ager Pageant feel at home at a punch reception. Shown with a few o f the awards which will 
be presented to the contest winners are (left to right) Bobbie Floyd, Joy Skinner, Naomi Phelan and Ruth Lyles. Trophies which 
will be awarded at the Saturday-evening pageant are shown in the center o f picture.

Forty-nine contestants in 
the 1975 M iss Texas 
Teen-Ager Pageant will be 
gin arriving in Clarendon 
tomorrow (Friday) to begin 
preparing for events in the 
contest. The fifth  annual 
Miss Texas Teen-Ager will 
be crowned Saturday even­
ing in the Harned Sisters 
Fine A rts building at 
Clarendon College.

The 1974 M iss Texas 
een -A ger, Cynthia M it- 
hell, o f Seagraves w ill 

n this year’s winner, 
on hand will be the 1974 

s National Teen-Ager, 
>t$a Lyon, o f New Port 

ie, Florida.
All contestants are due to 
ive by 2 p.m. Friday and 

k into Knorpp Hall of 
'^Clarendon C o llege where 

they will be housed through­
out their stay in Clarendon. 

S* The public is invited to 
f  attend the essay judging 

Friday even ing in the 
auditorium o f Clarendon 
College, beginning at 8:30 
p.m. There will be no charge 
to the public. Girls who have 
entered the contest are

Awards Day Held 
At Junior High

required to submit a 100 
word essay entitled “ What's 
Right About America”  and 
present it orally to judges. 
Only five contestants will be 
chosen to present their 
essays at the finals Saturday 
night.

Final judging w ill take 
place Saturday night at 7:30 
p.m. in the fine arts center, 
followed by a dinner and 
autograph party. The auto­
graph party will be held in 
the lobby of Knorpp Hall at 
10:30 p.m.

The 1975 winner of the 
pageant will receive many 
gifts  including a $500 
scholarship to Clarendon 
College, a $750 scholarship 
to the Fashion Institute of 
America at Atlanta, Georgia, 
a $50 gift certificate from 
John’ s in Clarendon, a 
“ Basic Concept, N ow ”  
beauty kit from Kay Eastep, 
an all-expense paid trip to 
Atlanta for six days to 
compete in the Miss National 
T een -A ger Contest in 
August and a large arm 
bouquet from Harlan ’ s 
Flowers in Clarendon.

The first runner-up will be 
presented a $500 tuition 
scholarship to the Fashion 
Institute o f America and the 
second runner-up will re­
ceive a $250 scholarship to 
the modeling school.

W inner o f the essay

portion o f the contest will 
receive a tuition scholarship 
from  Clarendon College, 
presented by the Memphis 
Coca-Cola Bottling Company 
o f Clarendon.

The entrant who receives 
the designation for best 
citizenship will be presented 
a $100 Bicentennial savings 
bond from the Farmers State 
Bank and Trust Company of 
Clarendon.

M iss Congeniality will 
receive a $50 tuition 
scholarship to attend Clar­
endon College presented by 
the Western Skies Motel in 
Clarendon.

In addition, the directors 
of the Clarendon Chamber of 
Commerce will present the 
national director, Mrs. Sybil 
Shaffer, and Miss Lyon with 
traditional western hats 
during the pageant.

Mike Wells, a recording 
artist from Nashville, Ten­
nessee, w ill arrive in 
Clarendon Friday afternoon 
to act as M aster o f 
Ceremonies for the Saturday 
night pageant.

Wells, a native of West 
Texas, w ill entertain the 
audience during the final 
judging with selections from 
his recordings on the Playboy 
label since moving to 
Nashville.

Phil Cates, State Repre­
sentative from Pampa, sche-

culed to be one o f the 
pageant judges, w ill be 
unable to attend because o f 
commitments in Austin. 
Takjng his place on the panel 
w ill be Zack Fisher o f 
Memphis, owner o f Fisher 
Red River Insurance Agency. 
Fisher is also a stock farmer 
and rancher and state 
Executive Director for the 
Republican Party o f Texas.

Felony Warrants 
Issued For Pair 
In Home Burglary

Felony fugitive warrants 
have been issued by Donley 
Dounty Justice of the Peace 
Carroll Lewis for two men 
wanted in the burglary o f the 
James Gillispie home about a 
month ago.

Lewis issued the warrants 
for Billy Wayne Reese and 
D.W. Porter, presently in 
custody of law enforcement 
officials in Wichita Falls. The 
pair are accused o f taking 
numerous items from the 
Gillispie home on or about 
April 25, including a shotgun 
and automatic rifle.

Donley County S heriff’ s 
o fficers w ere to make 
arrangements to transfer the 
two men to Donley County 
later this week.

Sixty-two Clarendon Jun­
ior High School eighth-grad­
ers received diplomas Friday 
morning at the annual 
Awards Day ceremonies at 
the school. In addition, many 
other students were recogn­
ized for scholastic and 
athletic awards.

Addressing the overflow 
crowd o f parents and fellow 
students were the valedictor­
ian, W ade Porter, the 
salutitorian, Janna Brandon.

In sports, Johnny Jarmillo 
was recognized with a 
football achievement award. 
Ricci Tunnel] received the 
girls basketball award, and 
Gary McLellan was cited to 
receive the boys basketball 
award.

Ann Callaway was recog­
nized for outstanding 
achievement in girls track 
competition. Ronnie Harris 
was the recipient of the boys 
track award. *

Physical education a- 
wards, consisting o f the 
Presidential Physical Fitness 
patch, were issued to 
approximately 15 students 
during the awards presenta­
tions.

Miss Brandon also receiv­
ed a special music award 
presented her by Betty 
Steward.

Duke received the journa­

lism award while Kathryn 
Purdue was cited for her 
work in English. Ricky Price 
received a history award and 
Richard Taylor was recogniz­
ed for spelling.

Glendale Heame won the 
science award and Shawn 
Barker was the recipient of 
the math honors. N an c* 
Johnson received the pen­
manship award and Barry 
H ightower rece ived  the 
reading award.

The 1926 Book Club 
presented Stacy Hohenber- 
ger and Deanna Cook with 
special citizenship awards. 
Mrs. J.R. Brandon made the 
presentation.

Receiving the “ Honor C”  
awards in the eighth grade 
class were W ade Porter, 
John Duke and Deanna 
Cook. Seventh graders re­
ceiving the awards were Lisa 
McAnear, Sherilyn Walker 
and Sabra Dodson.

Honor C awards in the 
sixth grade went to Rene 
Cosper, Terry Cole (whose 
name was not called at the 
cerem ony), A llen  Sanders 
and Carrie Moss.

Memorial Day Weekend Quiet, 
Only Two Accidents Reported

The “ W ellington  Slow 
Pitch”  Softball League is 
having a softball tournament 
the weekend of June 20,
21 , 22 .

Tallene Littlefield and Gary Davis were recipients o f special sporting placques Friday night at 
the high school graduation exercises held in Harned Sisters Fine Arts Center of Clarendon 
College. The trophies will be returned to the school after having their names engraved on them.

At least 31 people either 
visiting Donley County or 
travelling through the coun­
ty during the three-day 
holiday weekend are a little 
sadder but wiser this week.

All were charged in Peace 
Justice Carroll Lewis' court 
for alleged violations from 
Saturday through Monday.

State Trooper Ray Burch, 
working alone while his 
partner Dwayne Nichols was 
vacationing, issued a total of 
25 traffic citations for the 
three-day period, most of 
which w ere for speeding 
violations.

In addition, Burch investi­
gated „ two accidents twenty 
hours apart which invloved 
the same person on both 
occasions. According to 
accident reports filed  by 
Burch, Danny Holland, about 
19, was involved in an 
accident about 5:30 a m. 
Saturday about one-fourth 
mile south of the Greenbelt 
Lake Dam when his car hit

the back o f a boat which was 
blocking the highway. No 
injuries were reported in the 
accident, and only about 
$200 damage to the boat 
trailer and motor.

About 1:30 a.m. Sunday, 
Patrolman Burch was called 
to investigate an accident on 
FM 2471 about six miles east 
of Clarendon. Burch reported 
that a 1974 O ldsm obile 
Cutlass driven by Holland 
was wrecked when Holland 
apparently fell asleep at the 
wheel. He estimated damage 
to the car at about $3,000. 
Holland was not injured in 
the accident.

Burch reported that al­
though traffic was heavy in 
Donley County over the 
weekend, there were few 
problems with motorists 
here.

Lake patrol issued one 
( tation to the operator of a 
boat which cited five people 
with not wearing life jackets 
while operating the boat on 
Greenbelt Lake. Although

Two Clarendon Teachers Mark Retirement Sunday
Sunday will mark the 

official retirement date of 
two Clarendon elementary 
school teachers who, com­
bining their total years in the 
school system, account for 
more than 44 years of 
teaching in Clarendon.

Retiring as of that date will 
be Wilma K. Batson and 
Mildred P. Hendrix, who for 
many years, have occupied 
teaching desks only a few 
feet apart in the school here.

Mrs. Batson began her 
teaching career in 1930 at the 
age o f 18 when she began 
teaching youngsters at the 
old Ashtola School when it 
was a two-room school with 
only a handful of pupils. For 
the past 17 years, she has 
taught in the Clarendon 
system.

Mrs. Hendrix began her 
teaching carrer in 1934, 
serving the schools in Hall 
County (Bethel, Brice and 
Leslie) for 10 years before 
moving to Donley County to 
teach a total 29 years. Her 
tunure with the Clarendon 
Schools began 27 years ago, 
and has consisted o f 
instructing the first and third 
grades all of those years.

Mrs. Batson has been a 
life-long resident o f Donley 
County, and lived in Lelia 
Lake all of her life until 
moving to Clarendon follow­
ing her husband's death in 
1964. She was the daughter 
o f the Mr. and Mrs. H.R.

she was service, were the 
one and two room variety, 
including Ashtola, W indy 
Valley (just a few miles south 
of Lelia Lake) and the early 
Clarendon School.

She has many fond 
memories o f the children that 
have passed through her 
classes, including one 
youngster that expressed 
sincere wishes that “ he 
wished she was smart 
enough to go on to the third 
grade with us*’ .

Like most people, Mrs. 
Batson remembers the plea­
sant happenings more vividly 
than anything else, but she 
can also remember the days 
when teachers made only $70 
a month and considered 
themselves lucky.

For many years, she said, 
teachers were required to see 
that kindling and coal were 
brought into the classroom at 
the end of each day, ready 
for use the fo llow ing 
morning. When the oil 
burning heaters were ac­
quired in the schools where 
she taught, it was a day to 
remember, she says.

“ All in all, it has been a 
joy to teach the hundreds of 
young children that have 
been in my classes down 
through the years,”  she said. 
“ It brings a lot of fond 
memories to know what 
you've done for children in 
your career.”

Mrs. Batson began her 
teaching work when a 
teaching certificate could be

obtained after only one year 
o f co llege study. She 
obtained her elem entary 
teachers certificate after 
attending Clarendon College 
for one year and began 
teaching when she was only 
18 years of age.

However, additional edu­
cation was necessary to 
continue in her life-long 
career, and she obtained her 
BS Degree in 1949 from West 
Texas State C ollege in 
Canyon. She also earned a 
Masters Degree in elemen­
tary education from the same 
college in 1959.

Following her retirement. 
Mrs. Batson plans to relax a 
lot, travel occasionally to 
visit friends and relatives 
and persue her hobbies of 
painting and sewing in her 
spare time.

The first years of Mrs. 
Hendrix’ s career was marred 
by an unfortunate memory. 
While teaching the first year 
at the Bethel School in Hall 
County, the school building 
burned competely to the 
ground during the last month 
of school.

Although the county 
school superintendent was 
willing to allow the students 
and teachers a long vacation 
and do away with the last 
month of school that year, 
the teachers set up shop in 
one of the houses furnished 
teachers at that time, 
borrowed desks and books 
and continued teaching until 
school was dismissed for the

summer.
For the next eight or nine 

years, she continued to teach 
at Brice and Leslie before 
moving on to Chamberlain 
where she taught for one 
year and then to Martin 
School for two more years.

Then, she assumed teach­
ing duties at the Clarendon 
School which was located in 
the present city hall building. 
She has been with the local 
school system ever since, 
and has taught only second 
grade students with the 
exception of the first year 
when she had third grade 
students.

Mrs. Hendrix also attend­
ed Clarendon College for one 
year, then after a short 
absence, resumed studies at 
West Texas State College, 
receiving a BS Degree in 
elem entary education in 
1941. She completed re­
quirements for her M sters 
Degree in the same ueld in 
1957.

Not unlike her fellow  
retiree, Mrs. Hendrix hopes 
to do a little travelling and a 
lot o f work around her home 
in Clarendon in the future 
years. She likes to cook, sew 
and paint in addition to 
working in her yard.

Mrs. Hendrix has one son, 
Martin, who is presently a 
student at West Texas State 
University in Canyon. His 
w ife , Debrah, is also a 
student at Amarillo college 
enrolled in the RN program 
there.

Her husband, Amos 
Dewey hendrix, died in July, 
1963.

Mrs. Batson has no

children of her own, but 
adopted two small cousins 
several years ago, and these 
are her children.

Mack Tomlinson, 22, is 
presently attending Hardin- 
Simmins University in Abi­
lene where he is preparing to

become a minister, and 
Donna Kaye Scott, 25, is 
married and the mother of 
three children.

M ldred  Hendrix, left, and Wilma Batson, right, will retire from the Clarendon School system Sunday after teaching elementary 
grades for an aggregate total o f 44 years in Clarendon. The two teachers, who are looking forward to retirment. have put 
together some 73 years in the teaching profession in the Hall and Donley County area. The photo was made Tuesday afternoon at 
a short teachers meeting and ice cream social in the school cafeteria.

state laws prohibit Texas 
Game and Wildlife officers 
from issuing tickets to 
persons not wearing the 
protective garments, lake 
patrolmen are authorized to 
issue citations on Greenbelt 
Lake.

Game W ardens Dennis 
Thomas and Gary Hunt did 
issue eight citations which 
were filed with Justice o f the 
Peace Lewis over the 
weekend. Three were for not 
having fishing licenses, four 
for failure to provide enough 
life jackets for occupants o f a 
boat and one for operating an 
unregistered motor boat at 
Greenbelt.

Although Lake Greenbelt 
was inundated with visitors 
during the weekend, officials 
reported a relatively quiet 
holiday period with no one 
being arrested. Only one 
accident was reported, that 
being a youth suffering a 
broken arm. He was treated 
at Hall County Hospital in 
Memphis.
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Willie Johnson's Hedley
The U .M .W . met Tuesday 

May 20 in the beautiful new 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Altman in west Hedley. The 
meeting was called to order 
by the president Mrs. Betty 
Williams. Business was more 
discussion and making o f the 
altar cloth. A work day for 
the project was set for 
Wednesday May 21. A  gift 
was sent to the Navajo 
Mission in Farmington, New 
Mexico. Mrs. Alea Altman 
gave the devotional. The 
main subject was Christian 
togetherness, concern for 
others, fellowship and love 
for other. The lesson was 
given by Mrs. Verda Hinds. 
The members present were 
Mrs. Betty Williams, Mrs. 
Gerturde Boatright, Mrs. 
Mabel Jones, Mrs. Verda 
Hinds, Mrs. Willie Johnson 
and the hostess Mrs. 
Altman. _  . . _

Miss Myrtle Reeves spent 
the past weekend in Amarillo 
visiting with Mrs. Marjorie 
Boston.

Mrs. Dannie Bernardin 
spent the weekend of May 17 
with M r. and M rs. Roy 
Jewell in Hereford. While 
there she visited with Mrs. 
Ethel Kinslow. Mrs. Kinslow 
is with her brother there now 
but hopes to be back in 
Hedley soon.

A birthday dinner was held 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Graham Brinson Sunday 
May 18th honoring Mark and 
Graham Binson and Perry 
Beach. Guests included Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Martin, David 
Tate, Quay Johes, Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Owens and Caron, 
Mrs. Jewell Hart, Mr. and 
Mrs. Perry Beach, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Watson, Tommy 
Kelly Ann and Todd all from 
Amarillo, Alto Jo Reasonover 
of Canyon and Mr. and Mrs. 
Toad Hill, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Brinson and sons 
Ricky, Mark and Keith from 
Hedley.

Mrs. Wood roe Clenden- 
nen and Daren Cleandennen 
made a trip to Gladewater, 
las* weekend and brought 
back her mother Mrs. Essie 
Crawford. Mrs. Crawford 
has been on an extended visit 
with relatives.

TEXAS
TALK

by BILL COLLIER 
Branch Manager

I
The only true constant Is 

cSange. This universal cliche 
nUy take on some special 
economic meaning for the 
cattle industry. Some of the 
top ageducators and officials 
of the beef business are now 
saying cattle feeding on a 
commercial scale may be 
permanently changed. Rea­
son for the change is as 
simple as up and down. 
Rising input costs (especially 
grain) and lower market 
prices make it quite often an 
unacceptable business risk to 
feed cattle on grain rations 
for the conventional 120 to 
180 days in a commercial 
feedlot. Advocates of a 60 or 
d0 day feeding program are 
becom ing more popular. 
Some proponents o f the 
change are backing a current 
study to revamp the quality 
grading systems now used 
for b ee f classification. In 
essence the proposed over­
haul would reduce the 
relative standard o f p a y a ­
bility (taste) in favor of an 
absolute test o f tenderness.

FRST FEDERAL 
SAVINA A LOAN 

•f Childress 
S. 9th A Main 

Memphis, Tag.

M r. and M rs. Landon 
Duggins o f the state o f 
W ashington w ere H edley 
visitors the past week.

Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Beach 
have had a lot o f company 
lately. They include Mr. and 
Mrs. Josh Hill o f Martinex, 
Californ ia, M rs. H ill and 
Mrs. Beach are sisters.

Mr. and Mrs. J.S. Hinds 
attended the graduation 
program  at W .T .S .U . in 
Canyon May 17 to see Rusty 
Baker receive his degree. 
Rusty is the son o f Mr. and 
Mrs. Warren Baker and the 
grandson o f Mr. and Mrs. 
J.M. Baker and the late 
Harrison Hall. The degree 
received was that o f Bachelor 
o f Science.

W e are glad to report that 
both Mrs. F.S. Blackwell and 
Mrs. Clarence Welch are 
back at home in Hedley. Both 
spent some time in area 
hospitals.

Glenn, Joe Neal and Jean 
Bevers o f Amarillo were in 
Hedley Tuesday afternoon. 
They has been to Memphis 
attending the Funeral o f 
Judge Loren Denton.

Mr. and Mrs. L.E. Bogue 
attended the wedding o f 
Mrs. Ara Bogue in Amarillo 
Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. J.S. Hinds 
have been visiting his father 
in Abilene.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Tollett 
of Borger visited the Jap 
Shaws Thursday.

Miss Geneva Naylor has 
signed a letter o f intent to 
play basketball at Clarendon 
College this fall.

The Hedley Lions Club 
celebrated their 33 anniver­
sary with a Ladies Night 
Banquet last Thursday even­
ing. The Bicentinial motif 
was carried out in the 
decorations. Some fifty odd 
Lions and guests attended, 
out of town guests included 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Tollett of 
Borger, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wendell Smith o f Amarillo. 
Don Tarver o f the Wilson 
Ranch, - Glenn Doty o f 
Howardwick and Mr. and 
Mrs. A llen  Estlack, R.E. 
Drennan and Daughter Mrs. 
Grady and Jack Moreman of 
Clarendon.

The banquet was served 
by Mrs. Kate Stone, Mrs. 
J.M. Baker and Miss Angela 
Messer. Judge R.E. Drennan 
who lead the singing 33 years 
ago lead the singing Mrs. 
Fred Stafford, acting sweet­
heart, was at the piano.

President Fred Stafford 
and charter member Clifford 
Johnson acted as M .C .s. 
Tailtwister Windred Doherty 
had a part in the program. 
The speaker was Jack 
Moreman of Clarendon. Jack 

is the son of Ray A. More­
man, first president of the 
Hedley Lions Club, who 
presided over the charter 
night banquet. The clubs 
charter was Dated May 13, 
1942. The club has 20 charter 
members, 10 are still alive 
and 5 were present at this 
meeting. The Hedley club 
was sponsored by the 
Clarendon Lions Club. 
Their membership is now 39. 
Fred Stafford is the retiring 
president and W oodroe 
Farris is the incoming 

'president.
The new officials of the 

Hedley Lions Club elected 
Thursday of last week were 
Woodroe Farris, president, 
Melvin Boothe, first Vice- 
president, Travis Bland, 2 
vice-president, Doyle Mes­
ser, 3 vice-president, M.O. 
Weatherly, Secretary-Trea- 
surer, John Waddell Lion 
Tamer, W .P. Doherty, Tail- 
twister, Jack Stafford, W.B. 
Wiggins, Harold White and 
Fred Stafford, D irectors. 
These new officials will be 
installed at the June 26 
meeting and take office July 

The Junior High Gradua­
tion excercises were held in 
the Hedley High School Gym 
last Thursday evening May 
22 at 8 p.m. There were ten 
graduating into High School, 
five boys and five girls.

A former Hedley resident 
Glenn (Potty) Richerson of 
Shamrock was a Hedley 
visitor Friday.

Mrs. Lilli Belle Doherty, 
Mrs. Gladys Downing and 
Mrs. Velma Trussed were 
visiting in Hedley Friday.

The Kenneth Solomon 
family of Fritch arrived last

Friday for weekend visit with 
the Joe Woods and other 
relatives and friends.

Mrs. Mabel Bridges and 
M rs. M yrtle K irkpatrick 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Ike 
Rains and M rs. Ann 
McDaniel in Groom Memor­
ial Hospital.

D .R . and M rs. Ben 
Blackwell of Amarillo visited 
Mrs. J.B. Pickett Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Taylor and son Duane of 
Dublin arrived Friday for 
weekend visit with Mrs. 
Celia Lamberson, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jap Shaw and Ken­
neth’ s parents the Ivan 
Talors in Amarillo.

M r. and M rs. Henry 
Moore attended the Esteline 
High School Commencement 
Exercises last Friday even­
ing. Their neice Carol Moore 
was a member of the class. 
She was valedictorian.

Mrs. F.S. B lackwell’ s 
daughter Bertha from Cali­
fornia is visiting her and 
Mrs. Charley Johnson.

Mrs. Wanda Pickett and 
daughter Beth and Bill Tilger 
and Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Gailey and children all of 
Amarillo visited Mrs. J.B. 
Pickett Saturday. They were 
on their way to Possum 
Kingdom ESke.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Neal 
McKee and son Kelly of 
Pasadena near Houston 
spent the weekend in Hedley 
visiting the Roy McKees, the 
O ’ neil W eatherly ’ s and 
others.

The Joe W ayne W ood 
Family of Graver were in 
Hedley for the weekend 
visiting the Joe woods and 
others.

Clyde Tidwell and Adell 
Myers of Pampa were in 
Hedley visiting Saturday.

Mrs. Ann McDaniel is in 
the M em orial Hospital is 
reported well on the road to 
recovery.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Miller o f 
Memphis visited Mrs. Myr­
tle Kirkpatrick Sunday.

M r. and M rs. Harold 
M ithelmon o f Arlington, 
visited Mrs. Myrtle Kirk­
patrick during the weekend. 
They also visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Ike Rains in Groom 
Memorial Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Omel Hill of 
the Ft. Worth-Dallas area 
spent the weekend in Hedley 
with his mother Mrs. Eva 
Hill.

Relatives to attend Terry 
Collins’ graduation Saturday 
night included Mr, and Mrs. 
Melvin Terry and Malcolm of 
Shallowater, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lewis M eeks, Beverly, 
Barbara and James Williams 
o f Roswell, New M exico, 
Mrs. Dianne Gilbreth and 
Jesse Wade of Amarillo also 
a friend M iss Debbie 
Reynolds o f Clarendon.

Rev. and Mrs. J.J. Terry 
went to Shallowater Friday 
May 23 for the High School 
Graduation Excercises. Their 
grandson Malcolm Terry re­

ceived his diploma. He is the 
son o f Mr. and Mrs. Melvin 
Terry.

Mrs. Christine Brammett 
o f Quitaque visited with Mr. 
and M rs. Cullen Taylor 
Friday and Sunday Mr. and 
M rs. C lyde W isdom  o f 
Amarillo visited with them.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Bridges 
and children and Mr. and 
Mrs. Leroy Richardson o f 
Amarillo visited Mrs. Mabel 
Bridges Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. John Aufill 
and M r. and M rs. Ross 
Adamson o f Lubbock and 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Jewell o f 
Hereford were Sunday after­
noon Hedley visitors.

M r. and M rs. Leroy 
Conrad o f Amarillo visited- 
the Rov McKees Sundav.

Mrs. Clyde Thomas, the 
form er Tood les Greer, o f 
Plainview visited the Clifford 
Johnson’s Monday.

Congratulations to Mr. 
and Mrs. Jap Shaw. They 
have an anniversary this 
Saturday May 31.

This Sunday June 1 
following the morning ser­
vice there will be an all 
church dinner at the First 
Baptist Church in honor of 
the Pastor Rev. J.J. 
Terry and fam ily . Next 
Sundav Marks the last week 
they will be with us as pastor 
and family. This will leave 
Hedley without a resident 
pastor.

The next meeting o f the 
H edley American Legion 
Post will be held Friday June 
6 at 7 p.m. in the Legion hall. 
A  free supper will be served. 
New officers will be elected.

A happy Birthday to 
Martha Hill. Her birthday is 
this Sunday June 1.

Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Skaggs 
and M r. and M rs. Roy 
McKee Both have wedding 
anniversaries next Wednes­
day June 4. '

M r. and Mrs. W ayne 
Sullivan o f Dallas visited  
Rev. J.J. Terry Sunday.

Rev. and Mrs. J.J. Terry 
were the guests o f Mr. and 
M rs. Otis Holland for a 
Sunday dinner.

Adell M yers o f Pampa 
visited the Clifford Johnson’s 
Monday.

V.F.W. Will 
Attend
Meeting

INSURANCE 

FOR YO U R 

HOME 

RANCH 

FARM 

AUTO 

CROPS 

LIFE

For help with insurance 
questions and needs ca ll. . .

TEXAS FARM  BUREAU 
INSURANCE COMPANIES

•74-2471 Cloreodea

Best Buy* In fresh 

fruits And Vegetables

GIFFORD HILL A CO
Floydada, Texas Phone 983-5231 Night 983-5367 

We have a complete line o f

IRRIGATION EQUIPMENT
Need a side roll, bet don’ t want to bny, lease

Earn Froth Eggs. 

SEAFOOD: Channel Catfish 

Oysters in sholl Shrhnp

Sreaad Fresh Cun 

A WHuluWhuat
Fluor Frexan Fruit by Special Ordar

placed at the veteran 's 
graves Friday, May 30.

A barbeque is being given 
for V.F.W . members and 
their fam ilies and any 
eligivle, prospective mem­
bers, Monday June 2 at the 
Lelia Lake Community Cen­
ter at. 7:30 p.m . Amy 
member who plans to attend 
who has not been contacted, 
should get in touch with J.D 
Little no later than May 31.

The Local V .F.W . Post 
7111 attended the District 
Convention in Canyon Sun­
day, May 25.

Follow ing the business 
meeting they enjoyed a nice 
luncheon.

The Explorers Troop sold 
poppies for the V.F.W. this 
year and netted $105 which 
will enable them to but tents 
for their troop.

Flags were flown down 
town by V.F.W . members, 
Monday 26. Flags will be

Rites Held For 
Mrs. Bulman

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Lela C. Bulman, age 84, a 
resident o f Donley county for 
over 58 years, were held at 
3:00 p.m. on Sunday, May 
25, 1975, in the First Baptist 
Church with Rev. John Stout, 
retired Baptist Minister from 
Clarendon and Dr. James O. 
Brandon, pastor pf the First 
Baptist Church, officiating. 
Interment was in Citizens 
Cemetery with the arrange- 
ments under the direction o f 
Schooler - Gordon - Ro­
bertson Funeral Directors.

Mrs. Bulman died at 7:45 
p.m. on Friday, May 23. 
1975, in Hall County Hospital 
in Memphis. She was born 
on September 6, 1890 at 
Elmo, Kaufman County, and 
came to Donley County in 
1917. She was married to the 
late George Edward Bulman 
Sr. on December 24, 1920 in 
Clarendon. M rs. Bulman 
moved into Clarendon after 
his death in 1961. She was a 
member o f the Martin 
Baptist Church.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Mrs. Helen Land 
of Clarendon, Mrs. Billie 
Ruth Barbee o f Ft. Worth; 
two sons, George Bulman Jr. 
o f Canyon, Gene Bulman of 
Bell, California; two sisters, 
M rs. Hulda W ilson o f 
Memphis, Mrs. Josie Pea­
body o f Im perial; four 
brothers, J.M. Cannon o f 
C leburn, . Sam and Joe 
Cannon both o f Vernon, Jim 
Cannon Crowell; nine grand­
children and three great 
grandchildren.

Bearers were Pete Land, 
O.T. Hill, Traett Behrens, 
Lois Putman, Charlie Hearn, 
and Dale McGaugh.

M rs. Pearl Sargent o f 
Canyon spent the weekend 
here with her sister Mrs. 
Virginia Maxey and other 
relatives.

Mrs. Florence Hester is 
visiting relatives in Amarillo 
this week.

Bible School To Be 
Held At First 
Baptist Church

The First Baptist Church 
will have its annual Vacation 
Bible School from June 2 
through June 6. The 
Vacation B ible School is 
designed to teach children, 
youth, and adults about God, 
Jesus Christ, and the Bible. 
This is taught through 
Scripture memory verses, 
Bible stories, and handwork. 
All children from the ages o f 
2 through the 6th grade are 
invited to come each day 
from 8:30 a.m. - 11:30 a.m.

On May 30, there will be a 
Preparation Day for the 
Vacation Bible School. All 
children should be at the 
First Baptist Church at 9 
a.m. on the 30th. They will 
march in with the flags and 
go through the opening 
exercises just like they will 
do each day o f the Bible 
School. Immediately follow­
ing this, the children will be 
taken downtown to have a 
parade. They will meet north 
o f the Charm Beauty Shop at 
approximately 10:15, march 
down the street, and end the 
parade by the Post Office. All 
children are to be picked 
up at the parking lot of 
Junior’s Groceiy.

The Junior High and High 
School youth will meet each 
night o f the same week from 
7:30 p.m. - 10 p.m. for their 
Bible School. Butch Strick­
land, Youth Director o f First 
Baptist Church, w ill be 
leading this study for the 
youth.

W e even have a place for 
all Adults who would like to 
participate in Bible School. 
Dr. Brandon will be leading a 
study o f the book o f 
Revelation from 9 till 11 each 
morning during the same 
week.

So, if you are anywhere 
between the ages o f 2 and 92, 
we have a place for you in 
Vacation Bible School at the 
First Baptist Church. Come 
and enjoy learning about 
God. _____________________

M r. and M rs. David 
Conatser and children from 
Eufaula, Oklahoma spent the 
weekend with their grand­
mother Mrs. C. N. Brewer.

Martin and Debbie Hen­
drix o f Canyon visited 
several days last week with 
his mother, Mrs. Mildred 
Hendrex. Both Martin and 
Debbie have enrolled for 
summer school at W est 
Texas State University and 
Amarillo College.

New Cars
1975 Buick purchased by 

Patsy Gentry, W ellington  
from  Chamberlain M otor 
company.

1975 Pontiac purchased by 
Larry Turcotte, Pampa from 
Chamberlain M otor Com ­
pany.

1975 Cadillac purchased 
by Sam Bell, Amarillo from 
Chamberlain M otor Com- 
pany.

1975 Cadillac purchased 
by Clark Duke, Childress 
from Chamberlain M otor 
Company.

1974 Buick purchased by 
Kenneth M. Meyers, Pampa 
from Chamberlain M otor 
Company.

1975 Buick purchased by 
Jo Ann Scott, Conroe, Texas 
from Chamberlain M otor 
Company. -

1975 Oldsmobile purchas­
ed by Arnold Baten, Pampa 
from  Chamberlain M otor 
Company.

Band Awards 
Given

The Clarendon Bands, 
closed out their school year 
activities with a concert at 
the Clarendon College audi­
torium. The bands each 
played three selections.

Mark Maudlin, band 
director presented Out­
standing awards to: Out­
standing Colt, Rick Price and 
Kim White, Most Improved 
Lisa M cAnear and Most 
Spirited Rick Hayes o f the 
Junior High Band. The John 
Phillip Sousa Award went to 
Dram Major Jennie Barbee, 
Outstanding Broncho to 
Janie Hall and Most Spirited 
Broncho James Thomas o f 
the High School band.

Awards presented later to 
other band members were: 
Honor C Awards to Janie 
Hall in band. Pam Johnston 
in Choir, Jennie Barbee won 
the Outstanding Person in 
the Music Department.

He wants to help 
you tour Europe.

Before you enlist, 
you can select your 
station from a long 
list of Arm y instal­
lations ... here and 
abroad. Right now, 
Germany is available.
You have the oppor­
tunity to see the Europe 
that tourists dream about 
This, plus good pay, an 
interesting job and 
lots of other benefits 
are good reasons to see 
your Arm y recruiter.

SFC  G en e  T osh
317 E. 3rd St., Amarillo 
376-2181

Join the people 
whtfve joined the Army.

l e d g e r s

Coffee 3 L b ; Can $2 "
i Borden’s

Choclate M ilk Quart size 4 9 *
Borden’s

I Fruit Drink W Gallon

Parkay

Oleo 1 Lb. Quarters 5 9 *

' I » ; T m  P U "

30’8 Daytime

$ 2 3 9

7Bay.AWaali-MSBay.Vaar

ALLSUPS
C O N V E N IE N C E  S T O R E

1 ’ H
r
i  •

Shurfresh
$J39

B a co n  iu>.Pkg. j

Shurfresh

H a m S  3U>.Can * 3 " i; r ’

Corn Dogs
» 3 0 * \

t,

F̂ v 3.r 1 \

Burrltos 3 9 *

Bar-B-Q Ribs * 2 21 9
iV ,\)

Complete Line of

•Stayfoam Chests 

•Fishing Tackle 

•Tennis Shoes

Large Selection of Summer Hats ■ 

Picnic supplies of All Kinds

V » *



VT

V

it*

t

The Clarendon Pieaa, I M i j , May 29, 197S

a c

Lalia Lake 
News

M r. and M r*. Hollis 
Banister has their children 
home over the weekend 
holiday, Mr. and Mrs. Basil 
Banister and children o f 
Plano, Mr. and Mrs. Kelsey 
Banister o f Big Spring, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Black and 
children o f Amarillo, Mr. and 
M rs. Jack Leeper and 
children o f Clarendon. Mrs. 
G.L. Leeper and Mrs. F.E. 
Banister visited Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. O.L. Usrey 
returned home last Monday 
night after visiting in Durant, 
Oklahoma with their daugh­
ter, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Shields and children, and 
getting acquainted with their 
new great grandson. They 
visited in Manchester with 
Mr. Usrey’s brother, Mr. 
and Mrs. Burt Usrey, and in 

Quitman with Mrs. Usrey’ s 
sister, Mrs. Nellie Kirkland 
and a brother, Mr. and Mrs.

9

Clarence McGhee.
Mrs. Vivian Knox returned 

home Tuesday after visiting 
in Victoria with her neices, 
M rs. Sue Butler and 
children, and Mr. and Mrs. 
John Stepp and girls.

Mrs. Edd Mooring left 
Thursday to visit relative in 
Ft. Worth.

Visitors in the Lacy Noble 
home last week and over the 
weekend were Mr. and Mrs. 
John Aland o f Amarillo, Ike 
Nobel o f Arlington, Mr. and 
M rs. Lloyd Leeper o f 
Garendon. ’

Mr. and M rf. R.O. Nelson 
Jr. visited in Estelline 
Tuesday night with his 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Nelson.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Lee 
Helms and Marcy visited 
Thursday night in Vega with 
Mr. and Mrs. Genoa Goad.

Mr. and Mrs. J.L. Butler

■

■

went to Hereford Friday after 
Mrs. Butler’s sister, Mrs. 
Mary Wiltshire. Mrs. W ilt­
shire, Judge o f Music Guild, 
has been working in this area 
and visiting with members of 
her family. Saturday night 
the Roberts family had their 
get-together in Amarillo in 
the home o f Richard Roberts. 
Those to attend from Lelia 
Lake were, Mr. and Mrs. J.L. 
Butler and O.D. Roberts.

Visitors in the Bill Pbole 
home last week were, Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Willingham of 
Lubbock, Miss Oa Poole of 
Pampa, Mr. and Mrs. Ted 
Trulove o f Lubbock, Mr. and 
Mrs. Henry Hasty.

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Floys 
and family visited Sunday 
with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. F .A. Floyd.

Jeffrey Helms spent Fri­
day and Saturday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Koontz.

M r. and M rs. George 
Shields visited in Amarillo 
Sunday with their son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Donald Shields and 
children.

M r. and M rs. Boner 
Howard and Judy, Mrs. Ruth 
Dodson, and Mrs. Bessie 
Reynolds all o f  Am arillo 
visited Monday with Mr. and 
Mrs. F.A.

M rs. W .M . Mace is 
recuperating from surgery in 
the home o f her daughter, 
M rs. O rb ille H ill, o f 
Garendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Smith 
and boys o f Lubbock spent 
the weekend with her sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. L.B. Leathers 
and girls.

Teeny Woods o f Good­
night, and Theresa Shields 
spent Saturday night with 
Paula Helms.

Mrs. Bonnie Usrey and 
Thelma o f Amarillo visited 
Sunday night and Monday 
with her brother-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. O.L. Usrey.

Sheila Smith is home for 
summer vacation and a 
friend, Sherry Alford o f Boys 
Ranch, accompanied her 
home and visited over the 
weekend. Mr. and Mrs. Leo 
Smith and Sheila carried 
Sherry home Sunday even­
ing.

Mr. and Mrs. A.L. Thomas 
visited with their sons, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lloyd Thomas and 
M r. and M rs. Charles 
Thomas, as Lake McClellan 
Sunday evening.

Mrs. Bessie Reynolds o f 
Am arillo  vis ited  over the 
weekend with her son, Mr. 
and Mrs. W

an/*, grandghildren, Terri and 
Preston Byrd.

The United Methodist 
Women o f Garendon met in 
the home o f Mrs. J.L. Butler 
Wednesday, May 21st, with 
Mrs. John Bass, program 
leader, giving the last part o f 
the Study on the Book o f 
Johah. Mrs. Bass reviewed 
the entire book, with 
members taking part in a 
discussion afterwards.

Mrs. Lacy Noble and Mrs. 
J.B. McDaniel, accompanied 
by Mrs. Butler on the piano, 
had two specials for the 
group.

The program  continued 
after the noon meal with 
Mrs. Rolle Brumley and Mrs. 
John Bass entertaining the 
group with several piano 
selections. They a sing along 
by the members concluded 
the program.

Miss Ila Poole, President 
of the Pampa District o f the 
United Methodist Women, 
brought some good thought 
on several books she 
displayed.

Those present were, Mrs. 
Rolle Brumley, Mrs. J.R. 
Billham, Mrs. Verdie Harr­
ington, Mrs. Lois Hutchins. 
M rs. E .P . Shelton, Mrs. 
W.C. Thomberry, Mrs. F.

Sawyer, Mrs. H.T. Warner, 
Mrs. Frank White, Mrs. C.E. 
Bairfield.

Visitors were Mrs. Etna 
Wilson and Miss Oa Poole, 
the hostess, Mrs. J.L. Butler 
and co-hostesses, Mrs. Lacy 
Noble, Mrs. J.B. McDaniel 
and Mrs. Bill Poole.

M r. and M rs. Elmer 
Dishman visited  Sunday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Forrest Denton o f Good-

Mr. and Mrs.
had as visitors Sunday, a 
brother-in-law, Alton Scag* 
gias. o f Claude, and Mrs. 
Maggie Hunt o f Dumas.

M iss Grace Chapin o f 
Wichita Falls visited 
Mae and Mabc 
While here the three 
visit to Muieshoe.

M r. and Mrs.Q___  Grad
Henson spent last week

rady

G'nt last week with 
r. and Mrs. Floyd 
Henson and sons at Gallup, 

New Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. Cedi Short 
and children o f  Am arillo  
v isited  his mother Mrs. 
Jewel Short Saturday.

lighiit.

Y-Knot
Twirlers

There was no dance this 
week. Sure missed all o f you.

Graduation will be over 
when you read this. 
Everyone make plans to 
square dance all summer. 
Don’t miss just because it is 
hot.

Keep in mind that ice 
cream supper. Ice cream 
tastes so good after a lively 
tip.

Guy Sibley is doing great. 
He is just as spry as ever.

See all o f you.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Mills 
and sons Gerald and Jeff 
spent the weekend with 
relatives in New Mexico.

W M #Yn « i H
Om  Copy ur m t«  w

No Copy paper used.

Also Office Supplies & Furniture

CLARENDON OFFICE SOPPLY 
APRMIMO
G. W . Estlack

1104 S. Kearney Ph. 874-2043

Clifford Grocery
IH)l HI K SI \M|N K\ I i n  II KSDW S T A M P S  K

Bruce’s

ICut Sweet Potatoes
*' Large 23 oz cans

Del Monte

Spinach #303 cans

I Veg-AII

M ixed Vegetables
IRagu

Gold Medal

Double on Tuesday

All Purpose■  r u i y u s

A A e p l O U r  5 lb Bag

2  f o r T T  I  t
I  Kraft

These
SAVINGS

Opart Jar 4

>l Monte

I Bartlett Pears 2 #303 cans

jStokely

Fruit Cocktail 2  #303 cans

’ * 79<|Mayonaise $i»
C  ■  i m i  I  Quart Jar

3 #303 cans |  I ̂ raft ^  $100
1 ^ ,  I  M arshm allow Crinm  ,  j „

American Beauty

Instant Potatoes 8 oz Pkg. 3  for

Shurfine

Coffee
iDel Monte

ir  Fresheners Reg 49
Ass t Scents Value

All Grinds

22 oz Jar

oz

D ill Halves ^
I Bordens’

Sour Cream or Dip 2 s
Bake-Rite

ShortMlIlig 3 lb can

I Carnation
Light s

Tuna Chunk Style 6 1/2 0z can 
Staley

Pancake Syrup 24 oz Bottle

_  Glade Solid

79*

89* Lb I  Mountain Grown

]  Pinto Beans
49*

Chocolate Quik
Lipton

$|29 IlnstantTea

2 lb Box

4 oz Jar
$198

jit

49* I Peanut Butter 18 oz Jar

I Coffee Mate

lefffee Creamer 16 oz Jar

^California

Strawberries u  7  Box

Calavo

'California A V O C C d o S  5 for ® 1 ®
'Sunkist Navel W B » W > « W V »  -  s ,or ■

Oranges'
8 Colorado White Russett

$|00
4 lbs Potatoes

Texas Vine Ripened

Cantaloupe

1 9 * , h

10 lb Bag

Wilson Certified

Bacon "Thlck or Th,n
[The best your 2 lb Pkg 
money can buy]

USDA Grade “ A ” [Extra Nice]

Nice ’N Soft

Bathroom Tissue
_  4 Roll Pkg
Dixie

Cold Cups 9 oz 80 ent

Curity Daytime

Disposable Diapers $ « n
Tide 30 ent Pkg ■

Laundry Detergent $«09
Texize Giant Size

P i n e  G,ass Appliance and 
1 1 1 9 5  r l U 5  cabinet Cleaner

22 oz Spray Bottle 
or

32 oz Refill Bottle

Sirloin Steak
Lean & Tender 

USDA “ Good”  Beef 
Porterhouse Cuts

FRYERS 49! ~  -  '
Franks 12 °*

Shurfine

Luncheon Meat
Shurfrmh Halfmoon o z c a n  « 7  P 0 H| CHOpS *|39  |b 
Colby 10 o* Pkg -------- USD A Good or Bett#r

Vacuum Pack pk9

Lean and Tender

M E A T  SPECIALS FOR

May 28thv 29thv 30thv
lay, flwrodty, Friday t  Saturday I  Flash Frozen

Longhorn Cheese 8 9 '
Gorton

Fish Sticks 15 02 Pka 9 8 c Pork The old Fashioned Kind 
with lots o f good lean Meats

24 oz Pkf
$149 lb $ 1 T
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•Howardwick Party Line:
^  a. .  6t_____ a im . _By Sharon MUls

First o f all, I want to thank 
all o f you who have been 
saying such nice things about 
the party line. Remember 
you are the ones on the Line. 
There would be no column if 
you didn't give the news to 
share with others.

1 saw "in  Tuesday’ s 
Amarillo paper that Howard- 
wick’s fire trucks got some 
semi-headlines. Good! W e 

always glad to beare
mentioned favorably, aren’t 
we?

M r. and M rs. A lbert 
Moore were hosts to the 
M oore Fam ily reunion at 
H ow a rd w ick  C om m u n ity  
Center, Sunday, May 25. 
Those in attendance were: 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Moore, 
M r. and M rs. G eorge 
Franklin, Kandy, Mark and 
Chrisite from  Panhandle, 
Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Moore 
from Virdo, Texas, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Moore, Mr. and 
M rs. David M oore and 
Wade from Amarillo, Mrs. 
F.D. Lucas, Mrs. Leon Hess 
and Kathy from Borger, Mr. 
and Mrs. Freddy Cooper, 
Blaine and Quanette from 
Lubbock. All had a wonderful 
time and wanted to make 
Howardwick an annual place 
to come.

B.B. and Bernyce Winkles 
returned from  Plainview  
Tuesday. B.B. had been in 
the hospital there and is now 
feeling better. Daughter and 
son-in-law, Gwendolyn and 
Jim Cox o f Amarillo spent 
Saturday and Sunday with 
B.B. and Bernyce. The 
W inkels a lso had guests 
Sunday afternoon. They were 
Chick and Bernyce Gray of 
Denison, and Lola and Royal 
Jackson o f Amarillo. Ler6y 
and M am ie Durham o f 
Lockney were also visitors for 
the weekend. W .D. and Sybil 
Clawson, with son, Randy of 
Amarillo were visitors for the 
weekend, visiting them are 
their son, Merl and wife, and 
two children o f Dallas. Floyd 
and B illie  Gamm age o f 
Plainview were here over the 
weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Benge 
had as their weekend guests, 
his mother, M rs. Ralph 
Benge, Sr. and daughter, Pat 
Probst of San Angelo, Texas.

A

W ED R IN G

WED. R ING  
M A N 'S

BRANIGAN
JEWELRY
Downtown Memphis

Syb le ’ s mother. M ildred 
Duggins, Ralph and Syble’ s 
son and family, Ray and Judy 
Benge, and sons, Bart and 
Jason o f Am arillo . Their 
daughter and family, Sandra 
and Gary Hassell and 
children Chad and Dana of 
Amarillo.

M argaret and Vernon 
Berry entertained their 
daughter and family. Dot and 
James Gray and son, Berry 
and two of Berrys friends, 
Don Moss and Allen Hale, all 
o f Amarillo.

Jim and Thelma Corgill 
ahd their granddaughter and 
family for the weekend. They 
are Brenda and Bo and
children.

Sue and Bud Strange and 
children, Karen, Connie and 
Bryan o f Claude dropped by 
for a while Friday evening for 
a visit with Sue’s parents, 
Norma and Will Corgill.

Mr. and Mrs. Doil Douthit 
have their daughter, Becky 
Isbell of Edmond, Oklahoma 
for the holiday.

Congratulations to Glen 
and Joella Day. They 
celebrated the Fifth Wedd­
ing anniversary last Friday. 
W e wish them many, many 
more. Glen and Joella and 
daughter, Glenda Joe went 
to Carter, Oklahoma, Satur­
day to decorate the grave of 
Mrs. Day’s mother, and on 
Friday her grandmothers. 
Then Monday the Days were 
in Pampa to decorate her 
step-mothers’ grave. While 
in Oklahoma, the Days 
visited her brother and wife, 
Bud and Millie Terry and a 
cousin, Charles and wife, 
Trixie and family. W e wish a 
belated ‘ ‘ Happy Birthday”  
to Joella which was Tuesday. 
She said she is 21 plus. Also 
we wish her husband a nice 
birthday which will be 
Friday. He says he’ s 
thirty-nine plus.

M r. and M rs. Archie 
Collins dropped by to visit 
the Jimmy Dunns, Sunday.

L.L. and Katie Morris of 
Tulia were down. Visiting 
with Katie and Loyd were his 
sister, Cassie and Bill Dean 
o f Halfway, Loyd’s nephew, 
Marvin and Pat Dean and 
three children.

I asked Jim Milam of the 
Canteen who all were down 
for the weekend. He said 
everyone! So you know why I 
haven’t mentioned all the 
names.

Ed and Grace Castner 
have had a houseful! again 
for the holiday. Daughter 
and husband, the Jerold 
McDonalds o f Lubbock, 
granddaughter and family, 
the Don Buchanans, and 
daughters, Kelly and Kacy of 
Sweetwater and Mary and 
Kathy Castner o f Lelia Lake 
Monday afternoon.

Henry B land’ s brother, 
Holden Bland pf Dim mitt, 
was by for a while Monday.

The next W .M .U . o f 
Howardwick Baptist Church 
meeting will be June 4.

The next Volunteer Fire­
men meeting will be June 5.

The Friendship covered 
dish supper and games night 
will be the third Friday of 
each month which will be 
June 20. It had been on the 
second Friday o f each 
month-making it a tittle close 
to the Lions Club supper.

Speaking o f the Lions 
Club, we are glad to let you 
know and also proud that the 
Howardwick Lions Club 
donated twenty-five dollars 
to the Boy Scouts of Adobe 
Walls Council. The donation, 
will be used here in Donley 
County. The Lion ’ s Club 
does much good with all their 
donations. Thirty-nine at­
tended the last dinner and 
meeting. Tex Selvidge gave a 
talk on the Miss Teenage 
Pageant. Four o f the 
contestants were introduced 
and gave a talk on What 
America Is.

The girls present were 
Kim Radney, Liz Bromley, 
Tresa Kay Jack and Christy 
Cagle o f Clarendon and 
Donley County area. Kim is ' 
the granddaughter of the 
Huell Bingham's of Howard­
wick. The Lions’ voted at 
their last board meeting vto 
have the installation o f 
officers at the Country Club.

12 and the dinner will coat 
$3.00 per person. The next 
meeting o f the Lions Gub 
will be at the New City Hall 
and the meetings thereafter 
will be there.

The duct work for the 
airconditioning at the City 
Hall was done by Ralph 
Benge and son, Ray.

Joe and Margaret Wells 
were in Amarillo Tuesday to 
see one o f their God-daugh­
ters, Bonnie Ruth R iley. 
Bonnie Ruth is the daughter 
o f the Rev. and Mrs. Jack 
Riley. The Rev. Riley is the 
m inister o f the Trin ity 
Methodist Church o f Amar­
illo.

M r. and M rs. M elv ille  
Mills and Sharon went to 
Amarillo Sunday to do some 
shopping. While there they 
visited Mrs. Mills sister and 
husband, Dorothy and Wiley 
Ferdig.

was some good 
done over the 
Stanley Wolfe of 

caught a 7 pound 
Bass and a S pound Channel 
Cat. These were caught on 
water dogs. Bill Furrh and 
Joe Baker o f Amarillo caught 
a 6 pound Bass on worms. 
Johnny Just and H arvie 
Dunn and Chuck Young and 
Frankie Just o f Lelia Lake 
caught on a trot line a 10 
pound channel cat and a 10

Religious Thoughts
by JAMES O. BRANDON

Letter To 
The Editor

ar up 
heard t

Divided we fall” . The whole 
world is now more divided 
than ever before. Can we 
not, in this small community, 
stand united?

Bereavement and loss are always with us. Ever since Adam 
and Eve ate the forbidden fruit people have been losing loved 
ones and friends. David wept at the death o f ♦•»*« bo*t friend. 
Jonathan. Jesus Wept at the tomb o f Larazus. It is human 
nature to feel a deep sense o f loss when we lose loved ones 
and friends.

All o f us realize that human words are not sufficient when
we experience such loss. Friends, kind words, and love given

of loss.

There 
fish ing 
weekend. 
Amarillo

all help; but they do not ease the great hurt and sense o f
Only God can help when we are bereaved. The Bible tells 

us: “ I f  thou faint in the day o f adversity, thy strength is 
small”  (Prov. 24:10). Most o f us say. “ Amen!”  to this. God is 
not chiding is, but just reminding us that our strength is 
small. Job asked God to remember that he was but dust. 
Jonah spoke o f his soul fainting within him (Jon 27). Each of 
us have to confess our smallness and dependence upon God 
when it comes our time to lay a loved one or friend to rest. 
Yes, our strength is small, yes, we do faint and grow weary 
with the journey.

The prophet o f God reminds us that our Creator “ fainteth 
not, neither is weary”  (Is 40:28). When our heart is faint, we 
are encouraged to trust in God. He is the same today, 
yesterday, and forever. He never changes. The multitudes 
turned from following Jesus one day and He said to his 
disciples: “ W ill ye also go away?”  The Apostle Peter spoke 
an eternal truth when he replied: "T o  whom shall we go Lord, 
Thou hast the words o f eternal life.”  To whom can you go but 
God?

that are heard time and again 
here are the facts.

The Bicentennial Commit­
tee was appointed by Mayor 
Glen Doty March 3, 1975 and 
a chairman appointed at that 
time.

Its purpose is to plan a frill 
program, governed by Bi­
centennial rules and carried 
to completion not later than 
the close o f 1976.

The committee is author­
ized to raise funds to be used 
by the city o f Howardwick for 
the required projects which 
must be developed in one o f 
three thematic areas. The 
city siren system is

Mrs. James W. Dunn 
Chairman

Wedding

Mr. and Mrs. BUI Todd 
went to A lbany Monday 
night to attend the gradua­
tion o f their great nelce 
Jeanine Matthews from 
Albany high School.

They were accompanied by 
Jeanine’s grandparents Mr. 
and Mrs. J.G. Me A near, her

Announcement

our
number one project and

“ He

When we face great loss, we are encouraged to bring our 
----- “ And the Lord, He it isburdens to the Lord. The Bible says,

that doth go before thee; He wUl be with thee, He will not failthat doth go before thee; He wui oe wun tnee, n e wui nw 
thee, neither forsake thee; fear not, neither by dismayed 
(Deut. 31:8).

The Psalmist discussed the loss o f father and mother. What 
person, whether as a chUd or adult, who has not felt a quaking 
within at the thought o f losingmom anddad. Yet, the writer of 
Psalm 27 said, “ When my father and mother forsake me. 
then the Lord wUl take me up”  (Ps. 27:10).

comes under “ Horizons 
76-projects to provide for the 
future and at least one must 
be permanent in nature” .

This fund was started by 
all active committee mem­
bers turning in their own 
donation. Thirty seven gifts 
now amount to over $900.00. 
If everyone wUl do at least a 
small part we can have a 
program o f which we will be 
proud.

If all who are to benefit 
from this program cooper­
ates - and i f  you live here you 
will benefit - you can be 
proud you had a part in a job 
well done.

Mrs. J. V. Baldwin o f 
Amarillo and Dr. Jack T. 
Baldwin o f Memphis were 
re-united in marriage May 13 
at the home o f Dr. and Mrs. 
James Baldwin in Dallas. 
Rev. Paul Drury o f Carrollton 
officiated.

Those present fo r the 
reading o f their vows were: 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim C. Harris, 
Adaire and Joe o f George­
town. Mr. and Mrs. George 
Vineyard o f Dallas, Mr. and 
Mrs. Comrolly Baldwin o f 
Dallas, Jim and Bob Baldwin 
o f Dallas, Dr. and Mrs. Bill 
Wilderson of Grapevine.

Jack and Jo will be at 
home in Oarendon, 620 Sims 
St. after May 25.

Ronnie McAnear, Todd and 
Jennifer.

After the graduation, they 
all attended a reception 
honoring the seniors.

b ]

M r. and M rs. Harry 
M endenhall spent Sunday 
and Sunday night with their 
daughter M rs. Reuben 
Johnson at Hedley.

V
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DON STONE 874-2495

pound yellow cat. The Just 
family of Lelia Lake also 
caught 4 pounders and 3 
pounders on worms. These 
were also channel cats. Mr. 
W hitehead o f H ereford  
caught a 6 pounder channel 
cat on waterdogs.

By the way before I get off 
the line, let me remind all of 
you, both cyclists and car 
drivers to be extra careful 
since there will be more of 
both on our streets. Cyclist 
how about wearing your 
crash helmets? Let’ s hope 
there won’t be any crashes.

Bye and hope each has a 
very pleasant summer.

Sharon

W e miss the comfort o f God because we fail to turn to His 
Word, the Bible. When our soul faints within, the Bible 
encourages us. Said one: "This is my comfort in my affliction: 
for Thy Word hath quickened my (refreshed me, caused me to 
get up and live), another said, “ Unless Thy law had been my 
delight, 1 should then have perished in mine affliction.”

The Apostle Paul said that we need to learn to rejoice in the 
midst o f our bereavement: “ As sorrowful, yet always 
rejoicing, as poor, yet making many rich; as having nothing, 
yet possessing all things”  (IlCor. 6:10).

Oh, how we need to learn to lean on the strong arm o f the 
Lord! Said the Apostle, “ Yea, doubtless, and I count all 
thanks but loss for the excellency o f the knowledge o f Christ 
Jesus my Lord; for whom I have suffered the loss o f all 
things../’ (Phil 3:8).

Band Booster Will 
Have Special 
Meeting

Yes, we need to learn how to lose. W e need to learn how to 
suffer with dignity and grace and give glory to God in the 
midst o f it. W e can do this only when we find God’ s grace 
sufficient for our own personal need.

1, wo will bill
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Mark Mauldin, band 
director has called a special 
band booster meeting for 
Thursday May 29 at 8 p,m. in 
the band hall for th purpose 
of electing officers for the 
coming school year. Every 
one interested in the band 
booster club is urged to 
attend.

"Seek ye first the Kingdom”
Ladies Golf 

Playday
Ladies golf playday winner 

was Phyliss Jackson.
Because of weather play- • 

day will be extended May 
and April 5.

Pairings will be the same 
as last week.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
5th A McClelland 

874-2195
Wesley Sanders, Pastor 

Sanday
Sunday School....................... ,.9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship.....................11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship ..7:00 p.m. 

T— day
Women’s Missionary Council.1 p.m. 

Wednesday
Night Service............................ 7:30 p.m.

Voice in the Wilderness... CHURCH OF GOD IN CHRIST
302 N. Jefferson 

C. H. Duncan

i)

Carmen Wright visited her 
son M r. and M rs. John 
Sommers o f Dallas and sister 
M rs. Todd Shubert and 
family of Dallas; Mr. and 
Mrs. O.E. Jones of Denison, 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Hall of 
Stamford, Mr. and Mrs. 
Rufus Jones of Fredericks- 
berg, also had a short visit 
with Dr. and Mrs. H.R. Beck 
while in Fredericksberg.

Mr. and Mrs. C.A. Wright 
had as visitors in their home 
Sunday Mrs. Grady Tyler of 
Quitaque, Mrs. Edna Blair 
Johnson and Fred o f Waco. 

★  * ★ * ★ ★ ★ * * ★ ★ : A t

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Bugbee A  Third Streets 

874-3833
James Brandon, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School......................... 9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship....................11:00 a.m.
Training Union........................ 6:30 p.m.
Evening Worship.....................7:30 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service............................7:30 p.m.

In those days came John the Baptist, preaching in the 
wilderness of Judaea.

And saying, Repent ye: for the kingdom of heaven is 
at hand.

For this is he that was spoken of by the prophet of 
Esaias, saying, The voice of one crying in the wilderness. 
Prepare ye the way of the Lord, make his paths straight.

And the same John had his raiment of camel’s hair, and 
a leathern girdle about his loins; and his meat was locusts 
and wild honey.

Then went out to him Jerusalem, and all Judaea, and oil 
the region round about Jordan.

St. Matthew J 1-5

ST. JOHN BAPTIST EPISCOPAL 
3rd & Parks 

Pettigrew V. Hamilton 
Sunday

Sunday School..... ............10:00 a.m.
Services.................................. 11:00 a.m.
Holy Communion 1st, 3rd, Sc 5th
Sundays.

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH

5th A  Jefferson 
874-3667

Weldon Rives, Pastor 
Sunday

Sunday School..........................9:45 a.m.
Morning Worship........... .10:50 p.m.
Youth Program........................ 6:00 p.m.
Evening Worship..-.................... 7:00 p.m.
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CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
Hwy. 287 A  Jackson 

874-3479
R. W. Sullivan. Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School................. 10:00 a.m.
Sunday Worship..............11:00 a.m.
Training Union....................... ,.6:30 p.m.
Evening Worship ..............7:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service....................7:30 p m.

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
4th A  Carhart 

874-2495
Don Stone, Minister 

Sunday
Sunday School.................. 9:30 a.m.
Morning Worship............10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship............. 6:00 p.m.

Tuesday
Ladies Bible Class.............9:45 a.m.

Wednesday
Night Service......... ......... 8:00 p.m.

MARTIN BAPTIST CHURCH 
Garendon, Texas 

Charlie Floyd, Pastor, 
Sunday

Sunday School................. 10:00 a.m.
Church Service................ 11:00 a.m.
Evening Service................7:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service..............................7:00 p.m.

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
Hedley, Texas 

874-3663
Kathryn Pigg, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School.........................10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship............ 11:00 a.m.
Bible Study...............................6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Youth Service...........................7:00 p.m.

Several weeks a go ,1
to a clean-up campaig 
visitors that will be 
was a little difficult to I 
real buggers and need! 
picking up trash and " 

We would lifee to 
though it wasn’t an e| 
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somehow it is never

0

l '

V
Marvel

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Howardwick, Texas 

874-3762
Frankie Just, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School.........................10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship....................11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship....... ......6:30 p.m.

Wednesday
Worship................................... 6:30 p.m.

ST. MARK BAPTIST CHURCH
Jefferson A  Martindale 

Albert Yarborough, Pastor 
Weekly Sunday Services

Sunday School................... 9:45 a.m.
Preaching........................ 11:00 a.m.
Night Service.................... 8:30 p.m.
Prayer Service.................. 7:30 p.m.
Woman’s Mission............. 8:00 p.m.

ST. STEVFfS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Jefferson A  Martindale 
Rev. Vum C. Martin 

Weekly Sunday Services

METHODIST CHURCH
Jefferson A  Rosenfeld 

Rev. E. G. Gilbert

1
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FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Hedley, Texas 

J. J. Terry, Pastor

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Rosenfeld A  Kearney 

Hubert Bromley, Minister

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
3rd A  Gorst 

Gordon Oglesby 
Sunday

Sunday School...............10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship..,........ 10:55 a.m.
Evening Worship............. 6:00 p.m.

CHURCH OF THE N AZARENE 
3rd A  Hawley 

874-2321
Rev. R.A. Noakes 

Sunday
Sunday School......................... ,9:45 a.m*
Morning Worship......... »=00  a.m.
Sunday Bible Study.......,5:30 p.m.
Evening Worship......... A 00 P-m-
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CHURCH OF CHOICE
W .W . Wilson 

Weekly Sunday Services

Big Sol* m  all 
Knits *4wta*3w 
NOW *3*’

(Made Eapedally for You 
ready to wear faahlons.]

Cettia Ms PoUyosffor

*1M

Knits Far 
Shall* *3* 

Now *2**

ST. MARY’S CATHOUC CHURCH 
McGelland A  Montgomery 

Father Carlson
Sunday Morning Mass..... 12:15 p.m
Holy Days............ ..........5:00 p.m.

Father Carlson o f Groom

DONLEY COUNTY 
MINISTERIAL ALLIANCE
Meets First Wednesday of 

Every Month at 10:00 a.m. in 
Fanner's State Bank 

Hospitality Room

Montgomery A  Faker St. 
874-3756

Lawrence Thompson, Pastor 
Sunday

Sunday School.......... 10 a.m.
Morning Worship.... 11 a.m.
Evening Worship..... 7:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service........... 7:30 p.m.

The Clarendon Press

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
4th A  Parks

874-3428
Owen McGarity. Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School.................10:00 a.m.
Morning Worship............ 9:00a.m.
Youth Program................6:00 p.m.

* Evening Worship..............7:00 p.m.
Tuesday

. Bible Study......................2:30 p.m.

Dream Donut Shop

a

H i

w * ! 1 €•»»•$ 4 PcHytstor

:
J&W Lumber Co.

Claude Thomas Welding Shop Allsup’s Food Store
• R * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
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Friday, Saturday and Sunday, Clarendon College will be 
host for the fifth annual Miss Texas Teen-Ager Pageant. 
From what we’ ve been able to find out, tickets to the pageant 
are getting a little thin because a local demand is eating into 
the supply rapidly.

Although the pageant is not expected to actually bring a lot 
o f money into town like the Miss America Pageant would, we 
consider it an honor for Clarendon to be the host city for this 
year’s activities.

Perhaps the people who come to Garendon this weekend 
will be a bit disappointed with the size town we have here, but 
we’re sure that most will enjoy the wide-open spaces that 
surround this community and the beautiful scenery that is 
typical o f the Panhandle.

Moreover, we’ re sure that many o f these folks will agree 
with us that it will be a pleasant change from driving the 
crowded freeways and expressways o f the larger cities in 
Texas to get somewhere.

After alb about thetwdy traffic jam in town is usually in fron
After all, about the only traffic jam in town is usually in 

front o f the post office about 9:30 each morning. What could 
be better?

Speaking of traffic jams, i f  you happened to be one o f the 
thousands who visited Green be It Lake during the holiday 
weekend, you found true togetherness. Many late arrivals 
were forced to camp far from the water’ s edge, creating one 
o f the largest congestion areas this country has seen since 
Labor Day weekend last year.

Just by watching the traffic flow into town from the east 
and west, it appeared Green belt received more than its share 
o f patronization from far and wide over the weekend.

Out o f curosity, we visited the lake late Saturday night with 
friends and found the entire north and east sides o f the lake a 
mass o f reflectors in our headlights. Many families were still 
fishing at a late hour, taking advantage o f the few boats still 
on the lake at that time o f day.

Perhaps the amazing part o f it all, is the fact that Greenbelt 
Lake has had only three deaths in its history. Even one o f 
those did not involve drowning. This low death toll has made 
the lake perhaps one o f the safest in the State o f Texas.

While researching other news stories around the court 
house this week, we checked with Peace Justice Carroll 
Lewis, who also acts as coroner for Donley County, >nd found 
that only two persons have been victims o f drowning since the 
lake was completed several years ago.

The first recorded death in the waters o f Greenbelt was on 
August 11, 1968, when Joseph Shadle drowned after a boat 
occupied by he and his father overturned. Kevin Mooney o f 
Amarillo was the second victim, being one o f the occupants o f 
a small boat which sank on June 30, 1974.
, The third death related to Greenbelt Lake was on July 17, 

*1972, when a cave being dug by several youngsters collapsed 
and killed Richard Pearson.

Perhaps much of the safety record for the lake should be 
credited to the lake patrolmen and Texas Game and Wildlife 
officers who keep a vigil around the shores o f Greenbeh Lake. 
Many people who receive citations for violations while 
operating boats around the lake don’t like to pay the fines 
involved, but by the same token, have violated laws designed 
to protect them.

This weekend was no different, since at least four people 
were ticketed by game officers for not having enough life 
jackets in the boat to take care o f all passengers. This is an 
open invitation for disaster sine? it is not unusual for high 
winds to strike lakes in this area with little warning.

One other thing we would like to point out is the fact that 
although state game officers cannot issue citations for 
occupants o f a boat not wearing life jackets, the lake 
patrolmen who are employees o f Greenbelt Water Authority 
can.

This comes as a surprise to some people. Although the lake 
patrolmen generally warn the occupants o f a boat to wear the 
protective gear before issuing any tickets, a few people find 
themselves in JP court dishing out money for unnecessary 
fines.

Several weeks ago, we had an article in this space relating 
to a clean-up campaign in Garendon in preparation for the 
visitors that will be received here this weekend. The article 
was a little difficult to write since our building was one o f the 
real buggers and needed a lot o f work done cutting weeds and 
picking up trash and junk around the rear.

W e would lifee to point out that this has been done, even 
though it wasn’t an easy task. It’ s a lot like our Giristmas 
shopping intentions every year. W e intend to start early, but 
somehow it is never finished until the last moment.

oooo
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In an ad on the classified page o f today’s paper 
notice that the Garendon Press will be closed F

0
I

there is a 
Friday. We will 

be closing for a three-day weekend mainly because it was 
necessary for our employees to work Monday while others 
were enjoying a long Memorial Day weekend.

W e are asking that any business that needs to be conducted 
prior to next Monday be done before closing time Thursday so 
it won’t be necessary for our employees to come into the office 
o ff and on throughout the weekend.

W e’ ve found that the Monday holidays were definitely not 
designed for weekly newspaper people when that were 
enacted by Congress. There is simply to much to do on 
Monday around our offices to even think o f taking the day off.

The telephone la a necessary evil to our society today. A  
person finds it hard to live without it and almost impossible to 
live with it.

After working all day last Tuesday and all through the 
night, until about 8 a.m. Wednesday, we thought we could 
tike a few hours o f sack time at home without being 
disturbed. However, things around our house don’t operate 
that way.

No more had we crawled between the sheets when the 
telephone began ringing with what we considered 
unnecessary calls .“To remedy the situation, we took the phone 
o ff the hook and went back to bed.

A couple o f hours later, we heard a beeper tone which 
General Telephone uses to warn customers that their 
telephone is not in service. To us, it sounded like a lullaby and 
we drifted back to sleep.

About three that afternoon we found that the telephone 
company had disconnected our home phone because we 
wouldn’t hang the receiver dp.

After calling the Memphis office and explaining why the 
receiver was left o ff the hook, M.L. Van Arsdel, an old 
friend, patiently explained to us that seven phones left o ff the 

[hook could disable 100 telephones. The telephone people 
were very courteous and reconnected the telephone only a few 
moments later.

We appreciated their situation, and they ours. But just to 
make sure we could sleep in peace next time, the telephone 
system at our house has been altered by the telephone 

[company. If you ever call and can’t get an answer, it’ s 
i because we've turned the beP down so low we have to sit on 
t top o f the telephone to hear it.

by Mrs. Jess I

M r. and M rs. James 
Arm brister, and Richard 
Dragoo.

Mrs. G.L. Simmons was in 
McLean last Friday after­
noon on business.

Mrs. Dan Keller was in 
McLean on business last 
Thursday.

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
G.L. Simmons last week was 
their daughter Sue Anderson 
Mann and young son 
Johnny. Sue lives  in 
Amarillo.

Perhaps the trouble with 
most o f us is well described 
by what William Howard 
Taft once said: "Too  many 
people do not care what 
happens so long as h does 
not happen to him.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Leonard 
were in G arendon  on 
business last Saturday 
afternoon.

Robert McDonald, grand­
son o f Mr. and Mrs. G.L. 
Simmons visited with his 
grandparents last week.

1 am afraid that this 
column may be terminated if 
there is not more news 
turned in. it is quite a job to 
try and collect the news and 
there should be more people 
interested e nought to report 
their recent visitors and
trips

Please feel free to call 
Mrs. Jess Finley-779-3147 to 
report any and all o f your 
news items if interest. Thank 
You.

In physics there is a law: 
"W hat goes up must come 
down.”  In govemmerit there 
is an exception to the law:

An organic farmer is one 
who tills it like it is.

Mr. Alvis More man has 
returned to his dlgom from 
the McLean H ospifln  and 
was improving nicely at my 
last report.

Last Thursday when the 
storm went over our part o f 
the county there was 
considerable damage done to 
the City Hall Building,
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Simpsons Grocery and the 
Grade School in McLean, 
also several trees in the city 
park were damaged very 
heavily.

Alanreed School children 
made a fast trip to the storm 
cellar at the A.H . Moreman 
residence in Alanreed last 
Thursday morning when the 
clouds came over.

You are an expert when no 
one else knows how much 
more you have to learn.

Mr. Hartley Davis’ s sister, 
Mrs. Reed was in a Psmpa 
Hospital but is improving at 
this time.

Mr. and Mrs. P.M. Gibson 
visited the Gifton Pughs o f 
McLean last Sunday even­
ing.

V isiting M r. and Mrs. 
Hartley Davis last Sunday 
was their son’s family the 
Johnny Davis’ s o f Amarillo 
and their daughter’s family 
the Willis Mays o f Pampa.

The politician is an 
acrobat. H e  keeps his 
balance by saying opposite o f 
what he does.

Mr. Frank Crisp is at home 
after his stay in the Groom 
Memorial Hospital. He will 
not undergo surgery as the 
doctor said he would do just

Fin*

New
Furniture

A t Low Low Prices

as well without it.

M rs. Connie Fullbright 
returned to her home here 
a fter having ga ll bladder 
surgery in a Lubbock 
hospital. She is doing 
excellent at this time.

Visiting in Alanreed Tues­
day evening was Rev. James 
Thames He visited with the 
P.M. Gibsons and the A.H. 
More mans.

Bright people do not cast a 
reflection.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Crisp 
o f New Mexico were recent 
visitors in the Frank Crisp, 
B ill Crisp, and Frank 
Worsham home.

Mrs. M.B. Trout made a 
trip to visit her sister down 
south who had breast 
surgery. She reports that her 
sister is doing very well at 
the present time.

Mr. and Mrs. M.B. Trout 
were in Groom on business 
on the 20th o f this month.

Prejudice sets defin ite 
boundaries to dear reason­
ing

Mr. and Mrs. T.E. Crisp 
o f McLean visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Crisp on the 
afternoon o f the 20th.

Mrs. H .W . Burr is on a 
short trip to visit with her

l__fig**1-

son, Jack and his family.
Robin and Sam Stubbs 

visited with the Wilson's at 
Lake McClellan on i 
o f the 21st.

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs.
Bob Stubbs on the evening o f M rs. G .L . Simmons, 
the 20th was Bob’ s sister Mr. *nd Mrs. Dan Keller, 
Kay from Pampa

Life is a

V isiting the McLean 
Country Club last 
night were the

timed capsule

s j a s s s -.breturned recently from a trip 
to Houston where they 
visited with their daughter 
Kay and family, also got to

Mrs. Mildren Hendrix. He 
was a former daasmate o f 
Mrs. Hendrix’s son, Martin.

W . Buy* Sail
Good Used 
Furniture

T&M General 
Store, Inc.
Clarendon, Texas 874-2162

SANDS
16th ANNIVERSARY 

SALE
Starts Monday June 2nd 

Dacron Double Knits

2 Tables-------------------------- $229

4 Tables------------------------- s298

For the entire week, Monday 

through Saturday, you get at Least 

a 10% discount on all fabrics 
purchased.

Sands Fabrics & Needlecraft

Open Thursday til 8 PM 

Pampa, Texas 225 N. Cuyler

6  Cans 32 Oz.

Slmiloc Ready To Feed Milk
24 Cans 13 Oz.

| Slmiloc Concentrate Milk
24 Cans 13 Oz

Slmiloc Isomll Concentrate Milk $ 10 7*
6  Cans 32 Oz.

Slmiloc Ensoro Liqold Notriticn
124 Cans 13 Oz.

|SMA CoacoatratoMilk M 203
1 oz. Trial Size

12 Cans 13 Oz.

Slmiloc Advance Concentrate Milk
24 Cans 13 Oz.
Slmiloc With Iron Concentrate Milk

T 'V l lM  <020
100 Arthritis Polo Formolo By Anodn

TOOTH PASTE

#250

Dolomite Tablets
$1.29

Carry A ll Bag
$1.50

Panty Hose
•rfHOVtSCIWT ONM-OISIC Al»«lltlNG TOtLITS

1 2  oz.

Maalox $129
SX70
Polaroid Film *3*

$199

Alka-Seltzer
C0NT1NTS ?S TA0LITS

Large

Styrofoam Chest 9 9

$3.90 intimate
Moisturizer
Perfumed

Body
Lotion

5/8”  25’ Reinforced

Plastic Water Noto
50 Foot
3 Toko Sprinkle Hose

B u n n e l l

APPRECIATE

Pharmac
IE 1.1. R PH

BUSINESS

4)
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Gee's Fresh Fruits 
and Vegetables

David’s Upholstery

McCarty-Hull, Inc.
In this area the firm to see 

for all your cigar, cigarette, 
and tobacco needs for your 
business is the McCarty- 
Hull, Inc. at 3410 S. Fillmore 
in Amarillo. Phone 376-5495 
any time for prompt service. 
Be sure and ask them for 
their convenient gift catalog 
to make your shopping 
easier.

The management o f this

firm has made it a point 
through their service to the 
people o f this area to always 
offer only the best products 
on the market and to service 
their accounts in a manner 
they know will please.

Their courteous personnel 
w ill glad ly assist you in 
selecting products that could 
prove the most practical and

profitable for your particular 
business sales potential.

In writing this 1975 Review 
we, the copyists, take 
pleasure in complimenting 
the McCarty-Hull, Inc. for 
their ethical and community 
minded efforts in serving this 
section and suggest to our 
readers that they remember 
to contact them for prompt 
effective service.

Farris Furniture Company
Herbert Workman-Owner & Manager

■
> You’ ll be delighted with 

foe huge variety o f used 
furniture that meets your eye 
when you shop at the Farris 
Furniture Co., located at 604 
N. Fillm ore in Am arillo  
phone 374-0052. Delighted, 
because when you look for 
furniture that’s just right for 
your home, you know you’re 
going to find it here. You’ ll 
find the right design

available in the style and 
color you desire at a price 
you can afford.

Nothing is more satisfying 
than buying used furniture, 
except buying furniture at 
foe Farris Furniture Com­
pany, for they o ffe r  the 
utmost in satisfaction as ultra 
comfort and this firm will 
show you furniture that is 
designed for both. Here you

can choose furniture 
genuine living.

Go in today and see foe 
furniture that’ s just right for 
your home and family. You’ ll 
like foe furniture you buy 
here and you ’ ll like the 
budget terms too.

We, foe copyists o f this 
1975 Review , recommend 
this fine used furniture store 
to all o f our readers.

rf TD’s Lapidary and Craft-Hobby Supply
“ Look For New Location At 5732 Canyon 
Drive Opening About Middle of Ju ly "  

DeWaine Jones-Owner
ui TD ’s Lapidary And Craft- 
1IA Hobby Supply located in 
yti! Amarillo at 1400 West 15th 
ba> phone 372-7523, offers this 

community a complete line o f 
lapidary equipment and 
supplies. They specialize in 
rocks, gems and minerals, 
both rough and polished 
rocks, and make custom 
jewelry.

They feature lapidary and 
silver smithing classes and 
are coled on Sundays and

Mondays.
Join the happy rock 

enthusiasts, and enjoy a 
most satisfying hobby o f your 
own. Young and old alike 
enjoy nature’ s wonders, and 
you will find something foe 
whole fam ily can share 
together.

The next time you’re in 
town shopping stop by and 
look over their excellent 
selection o f lapidary equip­
ment and supplies. You’ ll be 
pleased to d iscover how

really inexpensive it is to get 
started in this enjoyable 
hobby.

We, the compilers o f this 
1975 Review, highly recom­
mend TD ’s Lapidary And 
Craft-Hobby Supply for
giving foe people o f this and 
surounding areas many 
pleasing hours o f se lf 
enjoym ent, through their 
knowledge and merchandise. 
Remember, happiness is a 
“ Contented Rockhound.’ *

Means Shoes
Lanny And Nancy Madden-Owners

OJ

Means Shoes is located at 
2713 Stanley in Amarillo. 
Phone 352-8271. This exclu­
sive shoe store carries a fine 
line o f shoes for the entire

£  tanlly.
It is under the able 

fT”  direction o f managerment 
well informed in the business 
and prepared to o ffer 
up-to-date styles in foot 
wear, and at the same time

fit  the shoes so that it 
actually fits the foot. Their 
ability in this respect has 
won for this many patrons in 
this community.

An occasional look at this 
store’s display window will 
enable you to predict what 
styles in shoes will be. They 
offer shoes o f fitted comfort, 
shoes which are your arm

chair’s biggest rival.
The organizers o f this 1975 

Review are glad to compli­
ment this store upon the 
position it occupies in foe 
every day life  o f this 
community through their 
efforts to always supply the 
customers with high grade 
shoes which actually fit foe 
foot at fair and reasonable 
prices.

-----» Perrin’s Draperies
Ray Perrin-Owner Mary Darling-Manager
Exciting, unusual custom 

made draperies await you at 
Perrin’s Drapery Shop, at 34 
Western Plaza in Amarillo, 
phone 353-1421 for esti­
mates.

Savings and economy are 
not just words at Perrin’ s 
Drapery Shop. There is no 
charge for labor and linings 
when the finished draperies 
are 60 inches or longer.

One o f the largest 
selection of drapery fabrics 
in this area can be found at

this fine establishment. 
Extensive selections o f 
solids, prints and drapery 
murals for every decorating 
scheme are featured.

The decorator trained staff 
will be pleased to discuss you 
color and texture needs at 
your home or in their shop. 
Decorative and hardy fabrics 
are also available here for 
use in business and stores. 
The staff will be glad to 
advise you on draperies for 
business and institution.

You’ll save by shopping 
here because this firm buys 
direct and passes the savings 
on to you. There is always a 
large assortment o f fine 
fabric samples and hard­
ware. Their custome drapery 
work is well known in this 
area.

Prices are reasonable and 
budget terms are available.

This 1975 Review and its 
editors, suggest that you do 
business with the Perrin’s 
Drapery Shop today.

Walker TV and Appliance, Inc.
This firm  o ffers the 

greatest value in television, 
stereo and appliances sales 
and service and is located at 
the Walker TV & Appliance 
in Amarillo, phone 355-9135.

They feature a complete 
line o f Frigidaire appliances. 
Sales & Service and with 
factory trained personnel.

Zenith has always been a 
name synonomous with 
excellence and quality. They 
are truly pioneers in many

Hoyt Walker-Owner
facets o f the electronics field 
so it is no surprise that their 
Color TV sets are among the 
finest. Their experience and 
record is your real guarantee 
of satisfaction. Whether you. 
want Color TV, Stereo, or a 
combination, this is the home 
of the best.

They maintain a modern, 
up-to-date establishment 
where the best o f parts for 
your set can be secured. 
They also have the latest 
scientific devices for testing

Forrester Truck Co.
This progressive truck 

dealer is considered by many 
to be the most outstanding 
dealer in this entire area. 
The Forrester Truck Co. is 
located at 731 N. Filmore in 
Am arillo  phone 376-6226. 
They are your authorized 
dealer and service head-

Juarters for the famous GMC 
t Kenworth trucks.
They are also yodr GMC 

motor home headquarters for 
sales & service their new 
location is at 8000 1-40 E., 
phone 376-5621.

Here you will find a unit

just suited to your needs and 
they can special order a truck 
built exactly to meet your
requir

The
luirements.

management here has
made it a point to hire only 
fully qualifiedd diesel techni­
cians who can handle any 
service or repair jobs. You 
will find that they have one of 
the best service departments 
in the area and keep a large 
stock of parts and accessories 
on and for your convenience.

In this day and age with so 
many firms offering trucks 
for sale, it is hard to select a

Emory Qeo-Ownor

Amarillo
Electronics

Paul
Faublon-Pres.

Bob
Hardin-Vice Pros.

Located at 1718 E. 10th in 
Amarillo phone 372-6551 is 
G ee ’ s Fresh Fruit Sc 
Vegetables, one o f foe most 
popular fresh fru it and 
vegetab le markets in the 
area.

This fresh produce store is 
operated by foe friendliest 
folks you’ ll ever do business 
with. They make it a point to 
handle only foe best fresh 
fruits and vegetables they 
can get.

You will enjoy their wide 
selection and fa ir prices.

1

Many a housewife has saved 
her family money by canning 
and freezing these delicious 
foods when they are in 
season.

They purchase their pro­
ducts from local fanners and 
growers as they have 
confidence in the quality o f 
food they raise.

W ithout hesitation, we, 
foe copyists o f this 1975 
Review suggest this fruit and 
vegetab le market to our 
readers. W e know you’ ll like 
foe way these fine people 
treat you.

“ Serving Clarendon A n d  Surrounding 
Territories’'

David Bryant-Owner

For fine upholstering and 
furniture repairing see 
David’ s Upholstery, “ where 
quality is higher than price,’ ’ 
located at 4632 Preston in 
Amarillo. Phone 352-4678. 
This firm has restored many 
valuable pieces o f furniture 
to their original beauty and 
usefulness.

In the line o f general 
upholstering and forniture 
repairing the render a 
distinctly superior service. 
Many people do not realize 
that the furniture they now

have may be o f better 
construction than most new 
furniture. Upholstering those 
pieces is the best investment 
to be made.

They have a complete line 
of upholstering fabrics to suit 
your choice. You can match 
any color scheme you desire 
at this upholstering shop.

Damron’s Jewelers

In this 1975 Review, we, 
the organ izers, wish to 
commend D avid ’ s Uphol­
stery upon the quality o f 
their work and we recom­
mend them to the people of 
this area.

Ronnie Schennault- 
Sec. & Trees.

“ The W orld’s Most Brilliant Diamonds’’ 
Homer, Nadine, Leslie & Richard Damron

for

The Amarillo Electronics 
at 1004 S. Adams in Amarillo 
phone 373-2834, can repair 
all makes o f TV sets. They 
have foe technical knowledge 
to locate your television  
troubles rapidly, thus saving 
you money on your repair 
bill. Be sure to call this firm 
if you would like skillfully 
trained men to repair your 
TV  set properly and 
promptly.

They offer the people o f 
this community reliab le 
service at reasonable rates 
along with expert workman­
ship to please you. They 
guarantee their work and you 
may rest assured that they 
will replace only those parts 
which are actually needed.

Remember a television set 
is a very delicate instrument 
and only experienced repair­
men know how to handle 
them without damaging 
them. In this 1975 Review 
Issue we, foe editors, highly 
recommend this television  
repair shop for professional 
Color TV repair at low cost.

Bring this ad in for a 10 per 
cent discount on all television 
servicing. Good during 
month of June.

The jewelry manufactured 
by this company are 
recognized by the trade as 
made o f the best materials 
and foe very best workman­
ship. They are sold all over 
the country and foe users 
have always been w ell 
satisfied and demand them 
when buying again.

They are famous for foe 
manufacture o f jewelry and 
are dealers in fine diamonds. 
They are exclusive dealers in

the Panhandle for 144 Facet 
diamonds. “ The worlds most 
brilliant diamonds.”  Watch 
and jewelry repair can be 
done on your favorite pieces.

This is a local business 
under competent direction o f 
people interested in local 
developm ent. Their well- 
merited progress is a matter 
o f actual fact well known to 
the public. This firm  is 
located in Amarillo at 1970 
Civic Circle, phone 352-6323.

In making this Review o f

the business in this area, the 
editors o f this 1975 Review 
are glad to call to the 
attention o f the people foe 
advantages occuring to foe 
public by the location of 
Damron’ s Jew elers here. 
There is no concern more 
worthy o f extended mention 
than this one. W hat we 
particu larly call to our 
readers attention is the fact 
that this is a local 
manufacturing company.

Friedman Iron and 
Metal Company

“ Top Prices Paid 
For Scrap Iron
And Metal 99

“ New And Used 
Pipe And Steel"

Bob Tennant-Owner

Amarillo Livestock Auction Company
J.R . Taylor-Manager

The Am arillo  L ivestock 
Auction Company located at 
the Western Stockyards at 
100 South Manhatten in 
Am arillo , phone 373-7464 
conducts livestock sales 
every Monday and Tuesday, 
and if necessary on Wednes­
day.

Here is an institution of 
this section that is enjoying a 
thriving business covering a 
wide territory. When you 
consign your livestock here 
you can always depend upon 
getting the highest market 
value.

This company has always 
assisted materially in foe 
growth and expansion o f this 
area as a trade center. Here, 
you are assured o f honest 
weights for livestock. This 
company conducts a business 
that is o f high commercial 
value to the public. Remem­
ber this fact-if the farmers of 
this community were com­
pelled to ship th£ir livestock

elsewhere, they would fall 
far short o f getting the prices 
obtained at the Am arillo  
Livestock Auction Company.

The composers o f this 
Review are pleased to give 
this reliable firm commend­
able mention in this 1975 
Review . W e assure our 
readers tht they will bet a fair 
deal in every transaction.

Why not gather up all that 
old scrap metal lying around 
the yard and turn it into 
dollars in your pocket? That 
is just what you can do 
because foe Friedman Iron 
and Metal Company located 
at 301 North Grand in 
Am arillo , phone 372-8791 
will pay you the highest 
prices for your scrap metal.

Memoiy Gardens Cemetery

C and M Army Surplus
A .W . Reader-Manager

The C&M Army Surplus is 
located at 308 Pittsburg in 
Amarillo, phone 372-7807. 
Here they feature Army and 
Navy surplus sporting goods, 
camping equipment, cloth­
ing, shoes, and tools at 
prices you can’ t afford to 
miss. They now feature mini 
turbo charges for car or 
truck. These turbo-charges 
will increase horsepower up 
to 28 percent, gas mileage up 
to 5 M PG , without any 
increase in air pollution, for 
only $9.95 see them today.

See them for tools, drill 
presses and much more.

When you select from their 
stock, you know you are 
getting good quality and

workman ship because this 
firm stocks only the best. 
Not only can you save money 
on this merchandise, but it is 
fully guaranteed as well.

They have a complete line 
o f men’s clothing in stock 
including shirts, pants, 
boots, shoes, and socks, and 
many household items. It will 
be to your advantage to stop 
here the next time you are in 
town and see the bargains 
awaiting you. Browse a- 
round, take your time, and of 
course save money at the 
C&M Army Surplus.

In this 1975 Review we, 
the editors, take pleasure in 
recommending the C&M  
Arm y Surplus to all our 
readers.

The M em ory Gardens 
Cemetery in Amarillo, phone 
352-1512. They offer families 
choice plots in this wfell-car- 
ed-for memorial garden. The 
management will be glad to 
have you visit this memorial 
park and see the beautiful 
surroundings they have 
provided. The entire ceme­
tery was completely re-seed­
ed this past fall, and foe 
management plans to re­
seed the area once more in 
foe early summer. After re­
seeding the entire area will 
be entirely covered with a 
luxuriant growth o f new 
grass.

Beautifu lly located and, 
improved lots are offered you 
at a surprisingly low cost and 
most liberal payment plan.

Unfailing maintenance and 
ever-increasing beautifica­
tion has made this memorial 
park more attractive every 
year. I f  you have not 
visualized its green sod, 
shrubbery, and bloom ing

plants, you have a surprise in 
store when you visit. The 
scene is inspiring. It brings 
one into closer communion 
with all that is beautiful. W e 
suggest you st6p in and look 
over the beautifully well-car- 
ed-for grounds.

This 1975 Review and its 
authors wish to call the 
attention o f our readers to 
this well-cared-for memorial 
park and to say they have 
done all in their power to 
furnish a beautiful and 
well-cared-for, lasting gar­
den o f rest.

W e all have scrap metal 
around our home or farm that 
is useless to us. With very 
little effort, you can gather it 
up and on your next trip to 
town bring it in to these 
dealers and they will sort, 
weigh, and pay you for it 
w h ile you wait. Copper, 
tfrass, lead, bronze, and 
aluminum will bring the 
highest prices.

This firm has built a fine 
reputation for reliable deal­
ings and foe editors o f this 
1975 Review^ recommend 
them to «all in this section 
who have scrap metal to sell, 
or have need o f selecting 
some materials for their own 
use.

help beautify Am erica, 
take your scrap metal to 
Friedman Iron And Metal 
Company.

Lott’s Barbaque
W .F . Lott

Open Thurs., Fri. & Sat.

Pizza Hut Restaurants
For Service Call

2825 South Western 
1601 South VanBuren 
1502 Amarillo Blvd. East 
701 South Georgia 
3305 Bell 
51st And Western

355-5871
372- 9322
373- 9364
374- 4521
352- 9391
353- 6541

When the peop le, o f this 
area sit back and relax in 
com fortable friend ly sur­
roundings to enjoy a 
mouth-watering, taste
tempting BQ dinner, they are 
most probably sitting in foe 
pleasant surroundings o f 
Lott’ s BQ located at 421 W. 3 
in Amarillo phone 372-0529.

This well-known BQ house 
is known in this area as the 
finest restaurant to obtain 
delicious BQ prepared exact­
ly the way you want it, and 
served with all the trimm­
ings.

When the owner here

decided to open, he had one 
primary goal in mind, and 
that was to offer the people 
o f this aref the finest food, 
served among friend ly 
people in a pleasant 
atmosphere, and always with 
the best service in town. The 
fact that he has achieved just 
exactly that is evidenced by 
the ever returning number of 
people that have made the 
Lott's BQ their place to dine.

The editing staff o f this 
1975 Review would like to 
take this opportunity to 
recommend this steak house 
to all o f our readers.

Don’t let anyone kid you 
about who has the best pizza 
in town. People around these 
parts know from experience 
that the best pizza is served 
by the Pizza Hut Restaur­
ants.

your set in order to detect 
anything that may need 
replacement or adjustment. 
They are familiar with almost 
every type and invite you to 
drop your set o ff the next 
time you’re in town.

Through the use o f their 
guarded recipes and finest 
quality ingredients this pizza 
parlor o ffers this area

authentic old world pizza in 
many delicious flavors that 
you can either eat in their 
quaint atmosphere or take 
out to go.

The management here has 
made it a point to hire people 
he can trust to give you 
friend ly service and the 
prices are very reasonable.

What would pizza be 
without your favorite domes­

tic or imported beer. If you 
like, they also have many soft 
drinks.

For delicious pizza you’ ll 
return for again and again, 
the compilers o f this 1975 
Review heartily suggest the 
Pizza Hut Restaurants. We 
compliment them for their 
fine food and friendly 
service.

Allison and Allison 
Cement Contractors

A .G . Allison-Owner

Western Fence Co.
The compilers o f this 1975 

Review  recommend this 
upstanding, friendly dealer 
to our readers. W e commend 
the Walker TV & Appliance 
for their honest service to the 
people! o f this area.

The finest in residential 
and industrial fencing may 
be obtained by contacting the 
Western Fence Co. located at 
2601 E. 3rd. St. in Amarillo, 
phone 373-8322. This firm 
specializes in material for 
chain link fence and four 
kinds of cedar fences.

This established firm has a

reputation for fairness and 
honesty built by years of 
sound reliab le business 
practice and efficient service 
by its many customers and 
patrons.

If you want to dress up 
your home or business now, 
we recommend you look over

their modern fencing pro­
ducts. Call for information or 
prices.

The composers o f this 1975 
Review, wish to commend 
this reliable firm to our many 
readers and suggest they 
rem em ber the W estern 
Fence Co. for their fence 
products.

The A llison & A llison 
Cement Contractors is locat­
ed in Amarillo at 4015 Rio 
Grande, phone 372-1752. 
Featuring contractors who 
will complete the job when 
expected and in a profes­
sional manner.

The management, through 
untiring efforts to secure for 
its trade the best that can be 
obtained, has built up foe 
concern to the present 
leadership it enjoys among 
the business firms o f this 
district.

Sound business manage­
ment is one o f the main basis

dealer whom you know will 
deal with you fairly and 
honestly.

The authors o f this 1975 
Review  suggest to our 
readers who are contem­
plating buying a new or good 
used truck that they see the 
friend ly people at the 
Forrester Truck Co. for a 
better buy on a better truck 
from men who they can trust. 
The management is to be 
complimented on their e f­
forts to offer the people of 
this area honest and fair 
truck sales and service.

Bushland Grain Co-op
Deep Steam Carpet Cleaning

VerlHi Vaughn-Owner

It is a well known fact that 
there is no one institution in 
this community that has done 
more toward the develop­
ment and progress of this 
section than has this 
reputable cooperative. They 
operate one of the finest 
establishment! in the area, 
and it came into existence to 
fill the need for a place where ’ 
farmer! could go for their 
feed, seed and farm supply 
needs and be sure they were

getting the best and most for 
their money.

Through their service, 
many of the farmers in foe 
surrounding communities 
and rural districts have been 
supplied with quality feeds 
and farm supplies at lower 
prices and thus been enabled 
to operate more efficiently 
and at greater profit.

_  The Buphland Grain Co-l 
at Bushland phone 352-801

is owned and controlled by 
the members who use its 
services. Through democra­
tic processes the members 
meet each year to select their 
own choices for the Board o f 
Directors.

In this 1975 Review, we, 
the writers, are glad to call 
the. attention o f our readers 
to their very complete and 
co m p reh en s ive  s e rv ic e . 
Phone 352-8059 for informa­
tion.

Deep Steam Carpet Oeaning 
in Amarillo phone 372-9871 
is the carpet cleaning 
specialists in this area with 
Jet Steam Extraction.

Jet Steam Extraction 
actually removes the deeply 
imbedded grit, dirt and even 
the dejergents le ft by 
previous cleanings. What’ s 
more, you can see what is 
taken from the rug. There 
are no brushes-nothing to 
distort pile or mat the fibers. 
Here is how it works-fine" 
heated mist jets into carpet 
pile-and lifts the dirt-power-

n

... i

in the operation o f any 
successful business. Intelli­
gent merchandising, combin­
ing best quality at a fair price 
is another. They have 
combined these essential 
factors and are the best place 
to go for concrete contracting 
work. »

In this 1975 Review we, 
the compilers, wish to take 
this opportunity to recom­
mend this concern to foe 
people throughout this dis­
trict. For a pleasant business 
relationship we suggest that 
you let the Allison & Allison 
Cement Contractors serve 
you.

Amar

The name Jacobsen, 
Snapper & Sunbeam lawn 
equipment has become 
synonymous with quality and 
durability. In this area your 
factory authorized dealer for 
their foil line is the Amarillo 
Lawnmower Sales & Service 
at 3903 W. 6th in Amarillo, 
phone 372-7811. They also 
carry a com plete line o f 
Roller Tecumseh, Clinton, & 
Briggs and Stratton engines.

The next time you are in 
town shopping, drop in and 
see their large selection o f 
these popular units, each

The Bechtold Gardens, 
located at 6027 Canyon Dr., 
phone 352-5520 o ffers  a 
com plete selection o f all 
types o f  plants, shrubs, 
flowers, and tree stock that 
you can choose from.

Home owners should take 
advantage o f foe services 
offered by this reliable firm. 
W ithout trees, shrubbery

25 Yea 
Surround

The commercial and resi­
dential experts in this locale 
for all electric contracting 
work is the Bryant Electric 
Company located at 605 
South Washington in Amar­
illo phone 376-5297.

This company has proven 
its professional abilities in 
this field through the many 
varied electric  contracting 
jobs they have successfully

The J.D. Prosser & Son 
Cement Contractors is locat­
ed in Amarillo at 1620 N 
Hayes. Phone 383-1337 for 
all types o f concrete 
contracting. These men are 
specialists in this fie ld . 
Concrete contracting is their 
major f ie ld — not just a 
sideline, and they are 
capable and efficient in all 
the work they do. You can

Daniell S
One Of 1

I

Dennis l

You can mow vour lawn 
quickly -and with ease with a 
Toro mower at Daniell Sales 
& Service Center at 1010 W. 
34th in Am arillo , phone 
374-7338.

In this area they are your 
factory authorized dealer for 
foe foil line o f Toro Lawn 
Equipment.

The next time you are in 
town shopping, drop in and

Rc
Roofs are very important 

in the preservation, the 
beauty, and durability o f 
your home or business. Don’t 
delay having your roo f 
repaired. The M ayfie ld  
Roofing, Inc. at 6801 Green 
Haven in Amarillo, phone 
352-5649 can repair or re-roof 
your home or business at 
prices to suit your pocket- 
book.

ful extractor removes soil.
This combination, m ist^i 

extractor makes this system 
superior to all other methods 
employing steam or exces­
sive amounts of hot water.

When you see the dirt 
leaving you carpet, you’ ll be 
astoundedi The fin ished 
carpet is truly “ Hospital 
Clean” . t

The writers of this 1975 
Review invite you to call 
372-9871 for the wall-to-wall 
carpet cleaning that ap­
proaches in-plant run clean­
ing results.

Dale’;
For foe finest in campers 

and pick-up coaches the 
dealer in this section to see is 
Dale's Camper Companv at 
5116 Amarillo Blvd. E. phone 
373-3411 in Amarillo. They 
are your authorized dealer 
for foe famous Idle Time. 
Brougham, Tioga Campers, 
and Mini motor homes.

This dealer carries a 
complete selection of models
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Ray’s Coins and Stamps of Amarillo
“ Paying Highest Prices For Gold And Silver”

Headquarters for hobby- 
ing numismatists in this area 
is Say 's Coins And Stamps 
ot Amarillo at 2727 West 6th 
in Amarillo, phone 372-4751.

Coin collectors are fortun­
ate to have this devoted man 
for their hobbying needs. His 
experience in this field over 
many years makes this shop

Ray Baskett-Owner
one o f the best anywhere.

Whether you are looking 
for coins to buy, need to have 
your collection appraised, 
want to sell one or many 
pieces, or need information 
about coin collecting in any 
form, you can be assu. :d 
with com plete confidence 
that this shop will handle the

Amarillo Lawnmower Sales 
and Service

’ rices Paid 
scrap Iron 
Metal” 1
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A
nant-Owner
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The name Jacobsen, 
Snapper & Sunbeam lawn 
equipment has become 
synonymous with quality and 
durability. In this area your 
factory authorized dealer for 
their full line is the Amarillo 
Lawnmower Sales Sc Service 
at 3903 W. 6th in Amarillo, 
phone 372-7811. They also 
carry a com plete line o f 
Roller Tecumseh, Clinton, Sc 
Briggs and Stratton engines.

The next time you are in 
town shopping, drop in and 
see their large selection of 
these popular units, each

designed for particular use 
and in a wide range o f prices. 
You can depend on them to 
get the job done year after 
year, quickly and with very 
little repair.

For all o f  your lawn 
equipment and blade shar­
pening needs, this is the 
place to go. They can handle 
any job in a short time and a 
low cost. Their stock o f parts 
helps guarantee fast service, 
and their experience in this 
field assures you o f a good 
job.

The compilers o f this 1975

Review commend this dealer 
for their honest and fair 
dealings, and remind our 
readers that any time o f the 
y£ar, summer or winter, is a 
good time to see the Amarillo 
Lawnmower Sales Sc Service 
for your lawn equipment 
needs, repair and service. 
Amarillo Lawnmower Sales 
Sc Service fo r  you lawn 
equipment needs, repair and 
service. Am arillo  Lawn 
mower Sales Sc Service, are 
your authorized dealer for 
McCulloch, Stihl and Home- 
lite chainsaws.

Bechtold Gardens
Doug Crowe-Manger -

The Bechtold Gardens, 
located at 6027 Canyon Dr., 
phone 352-5520 o ffers  a 
com plete selection o f all 
types o f plants, shrubs, 
flowers, and tree stock that 
you can choose from.

Home owners should take 
advantage of the services 
offered by this reliable firm. 
W ithout trees, shrubbery

and flowers, any home looks 
plain. Not only does 
landscaping help to beautify 
a home, but it increases its 
value as well. When you 
select shrubbery or trees for 
your yard, it is as permanent 
as the home itself.

Bechtold Gardens has 
many year o f experience in 
this fie ld  and they .are

experts. They are always 
willing to discuss plans and 
advise you on any job. You 
w ill find their saleshelp 
friendly and their price right.

We, the writers o f this 
1975 Review, suggest you 
make this well thought of 
nursery your headquarters 
fo r all your landscaping 
stock.

Biyant Electric Company
25 Years Serving A m a rillo  And 
Surrounding Area

The commercial and resi­
dential experts in this locale 
for all electric contracting 
work is the Bryant Electric 
Company located at 605 
South Washington in Amar­
illo phone 376-5297.

This company has proven 
its professional abilities in 
this field through the many 
varied e lectric contracting 
jobs they have successfully

completed to the satisfaction 
o f the customer.

They are fully licensed and 
insured by the state and can 
handle any wiring job from 
remodeling to new construc­
tion and are more than glad 
to g ive  you com plete 
inspection and recommenda­
tion as well as accurage cost 
estimates at any time.

The electricians in their 
employ are fully qualified to

handle any job and complete 
it in the shortest time 
possible.

The designers o f this 1975 
Review, without hesitation, 
recommend this reputable 
contractor to anyone who 
might need this type o f 
service and commend the 
Bryant E lectric Company 
on the many fine business 
practices they adhere to.

J. D. Prosser and Sons
The J.D. Prosser Sc Son 

Cement Contractors is locat­
ed in Amarillo at 1620 N 
Hayes. Phone 383-1337 for 
all types o f concrete 
contracting. These men are 
specialists in this fie ld . 
Concrete contracting is their 
major f ie ld — not just a 
sideline, and they are 
capable and efficient in all 
the work they do. You can

Cement Contractors
depend on the reliability o f 
this firm for they have built 
an envied reputation for 
themselves throughout this 
entire section.

When you have construc­
tion that calls for the aid o f a 
concrete contractor, call J.D. 
Prosser Sc Sons Cement 
Contractors first. They will 
show personal attention to

your problems and help you 
work out the plans with 
estim ates. You w ill be 
welcome and will receive 
courteous attention from the 
men here. Regardless o f the 
size o f the job, this 1975 
Review and its staff advises 
you contact the J.D. Prosser 
Sc Sons Cement Contractors 
if you want the job done 
right.

*

Daniell Sales and Service Center
One Of The Family Owned & Operated 

Businesses In Amarillo 
Dennis & A n n  D aniell, Jack-Shirley 

Daniell Denise Daniell
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You can mow vour lawn 
quickly-and with ease with a 
Toro mower at Daniell Sales 
Sc Service Center at 1010 W. 
34th in Am arillo , phone 
374-7338.

In this area they are your 
factory authorized dealer for 
the full line o f Toro Lawn 
Equipment.

The next time you are in 
town shopping, drop in and

see their large selection of 
these popular units, each 
designed for a particular use 
and in a wide range o f prices. 
You can depend on them to 
get the job done year after 
year, quickly and with very 
littleRepair.

Power mowers need spec­
ial care and periodic service. 
Take yours to them for 
cleaning and adjustments to 
keep it in proper condition.

Call today and arrange to 
have this work done as soon 
as possible.

For expert authorized reel 
and rotary lawn mower blade 
sharpening and general 
repairing the editors o f this 
1975 Town and Country 
Review  suggest that you 
contact this firm. Mrs. Ann 
Raney Daniell, Co-Owner, is 
a native o f Garendon.

Mayfield Roofing, Inc.
Ronnie Mayfield-President

Roofs are very important Many people do not know 
in the preservation, the just what type o f roof they 
beauty, and durability o f should have on their home to 
your home or business. Don’t add to its beauty and
delay having your roof 
repaired. The M ayfie ld  
Roofing, Inc. at 6801 Green 
Haven in Amarillo, phone 
352-5649 can repair or re-roof 
your home or business at 
prices to suit your pocket- 
book.

durability. This firm  will 
explain the various roofing 
materials and their advant­
ages to you. They have a 
varied selection o f materials 
and colors from which you 
may choose.

These workmen have had

Dale’s Camper Company
For the finest in campers 

and pick-up coaches the 
dealer in this section to see is 
Dale’s Camper Company at 
5116 Amarillo Blvd. E. phone 
373-3411 in Amarillo. They 
are your authorized dealer 
for the famous Idle Time. 
Brougham, Tioga Campers, 
and Mini motor homes.

This dealer carries a 
complete selection of models

Dale Peay
in many sizes and price 
ranges, and can arrange 
imnMdiate financing to fit 
your budget. Rem ember 
Dale gives everyone a 20 per 
cent discount on all parts and 
accessories.

Their friend ly salesmen 
can help you tailor the unit 
you pick perfectly to your car 
or truck, so that when the 
deal is complete you can be

locaded and ready to start 
that awaited vacation.

Dale’ s Camper Company 
receives the full endorse­
ment from the drafters o f this 
1975 Review and suggest to 
our leaders that they let this 
reputable firm help you enjoy 
your vacation this year with a 
new camper or pick-up 
coach. You will enjoy their 
friendly, honest sendee.

Amarillo Health Care Center
Glenda Reeves-Adminlstrator

The Amarillo Health Care 
Center is located at 4033 
West 51st in Amarillo, phone 
355-4488. Here they offer 
complete care o f the aged, 
sick, and convalescent.

This convalescent home is 
well located, has plenty o f 
sunshine, never enough 
noise to bother the sick, yet 
near enough to town so 
friends and relatives o f 
guests can call without 
inconvenience.

Heating, ventilation and 
sanitary arrangements are 
most completely planned for 
the comfort o f each guest and 
all methods are approved by 
t£e supervising medical 
authorities.

All rooms are light and 
cheerfu lly decorated, and 
have that home atmosphere 
which has a good psychologi­
cal effect.

Their food is prepared by a 
specialist on diets under the 
most sanitary conditions,

g iv ing
balance

the guests well 
balanced meals, nourishing 
and appetizing, for rebuild­
ing the health and strength 
so necessary for the inactive 
person.

This and the surrounding 
territory is very fortunate in 
having a nursing home, “ So 
like a hom e." The authors of 
this 1975 Review are proud to 
make particular mention o f 
this well-run nursing home 
who open their doors to all.

E-Way Mobile Mart
Over 20 Years Experience 

Andy Dewees-Owner

There are millions o f 
people liv in g in mobile 
homes today because o f the 
high price o f real estate and 
rent. Then, too, they have 
d iscovered it is a very- 
convenient, carefree and 
economical way o f life with 
no land problems. A  home o f 
this type can often be 
purchased for less than the 
price o f a new automobile 
and paid for in convenient 
monthly payments over a 
long period o f time. They 
specialize in repossesed, and 
used mobile homes. They

also give a 5 per cent Federal 
Income Tax Rebate for 1975 
models currently in stock 
which are top quality mobil 
homes.

They are occupied by a 
high class of people who are 
engaged in various occupa­
tions. A  number are 
purchased each year for 
portable ranch homes and for 
servicem en. The manager 
has been in the mobile home 
business for some time and 
offers only mobile homes 
that he can personally

recommend that are well 
constructed and priced so the 
intending purchaser gets the 
very best for his money.

See the E-W ay M obile 
Mart located at Canyon 
Expressway and McConnic 
Rd. in Am arillo phone 
352-9251 for all your mobile 
home needs.

The editing staff o f this 
1975 Review point with pride 
to this trustworthy dealer 
and suggest to our readers 
that you let him explain the 
advantage o f mobile home 
living.

Master Drapery Service Co.
i i Drapery Cleaning Is Our Only Business”

This is an experienced 
organization in the Amarillo 
trade territory, feature Ad- 
just-A-Drape professional 
drapery cleaning service. 
Master Drapery Service, at 
3515 Woffling, phone 3771 is 
an experienced company, 
organized and operated by 
Joe Snead, and offers to the 
housew ife a specialized 
drapery cleaning service. 
Through the use o f their 
specialized equipment and 
trained personnel they can 
guarantee that your draper­
ies will be returned to you

the same length and even 
hemlines. This is the first 
and only guarantee o f this 
kind in the Texas Panhandle. 
The Adjust-A-Drape mach­
ine also automatically sets in 
decorator pleats to give the 
“ New Look’ ’ to your 
draperies.

Draperies brought in to 
their plant in the morning 
can be picked up that 
afternoon, ready to hang in 
your windows.

For those who desire, they 
also o ffer a complete,

Joe’s Garage

professional installation ser­
vice. Their trained personnel 
will come into your home and 
your draperies, professional­
ly clean them with their 
Adjust-A-Drape machine Sc 
expertly re-hang them in 
your home. Master Drapery 
Service has hired factory 
trained personnel to offer 
this service.

We, the editors o f this 
1975 Review recommend to 
all our readers that they take 
advantage o f this complete 
professional drapery clean­
ing service.

“ When Service And Quality Count’
• °

Joe Fraumane-Owner
In the past few years the 

automobile industry has 
turned their once nut and 
bolt jalopy into a complex 
piece o f precision engineered 
equipment built fo r high

r d and strenuous uses.
longer can any

mechanic properly repair 
your car problems today.

They offer you complete 
auto repair service on 
automatic transmissions, air 
conditioning, wheel a lign­

ment Sc balancing and 
Marquette Electronic Engine 
Diagnosis.

That is why the people o f 
this area have turned to the 
Joe’ s Garage located at 211 
South Ty ler in Am arillo 
phone 372-5621 for expert, 
professional repair work.

They have taken the time 
to learn the proper procedure 
for repairing today’s auto­
mobile and use only the

latest factory approved 
equipment. Once the job is 
finished, you can be sure that 
it is done right and you won’t 
have to take it back to get the 
Ujprk completed.

The compilers of this 1975 
Review recommend to our 
readers that when they need 
expert repair work, they take 
their car to the friendly 
professionals at Joe’s Gar­
age. We know you’ll be glad 
you did.

Bob Getman Cement Contractor
“ The Company with Creative Elders in

years o f experience and they 
give personal attention to 
every job. If you are in need 
o f services o f this kind, call 
them or stop by their office 
and they will gladly give 
you estimates.

The writers o f this 1975 
Review wish to recommend 
this prominent firm to all of 
our readers for all roofing 
work.

The Bob Getman Cement 
Contractor at 416 Caddo in 
Ty ler phone 383-7416 it  
regarded in this area by 
persons who have had them 
handle concrete contracting 
work for them as contractors 
who will complete the job 
when expected and in a 
professional manner.

They specialize in storm 
cellers, basements, boot pits, 
grain storage bins, stab

Concrete”
Bob Gatman-Owner
foundations, side walks, 
drive ways and “ concrete 
finishing.

So whether you need 
concrete for foundations, 
walks, patios, commercial or 
industrial application, they 
can be trusted to complete 
the job with highly skilled 
workmen who are completely 
familiar with this line oif 
work.

The contractors here have

strived since their beginning 
to furnish reasonably priced 
bids with the highest quality 
work.

For dependability, quality 
work and fa ir business 
dealings, the orginators of 
this 1975 Review make the 
sussestion to our readers 
that they contact the Bob 
Getman Cement Contractor. 
We know you’ ll be glad you 
did.

Letter's Pancake House
“ Banquet And Party Room”

Mel And Diane Carlile-Managers
Throughout the years the 

pancake house has become a 
real tradition and a favorite 
in America. Leflar’s Pancake 
House located at 7901 
Am arillo  Blvd. W est in 
Amarillo, phone 355-3271 is 
noted throughout this area as 
the place to go when you 
want to enjoy the true flavor 
o f homemade pancakes.

You'll find their pancakes to 
be the lightest and tastiest o f 
any and they offer a wide 
selection from which you can

choose.
They feature a spacious 

dining area for dining as well 
as private banquets and 
parties.

In addition to the many 
different types o f pancakes, 
they offer one o f the best 
breakfast menus, lunch 
selections, and dinner 
choices to suit anyones' taste 
preference.

The manner in which this 
fine restaurant is operated is 
evidenced through the pat- 
rongage from this area.

You ’ ll find their kitchen 
spotlessly clean with only the 
finest o f modem equipment 
being used. Every ingredient 
used is o f the best available 
and prepared in a most 
professional manner.

The editors of this 1975 
Review suggest the next time 
you are in town be sure to 
stop in at Leflar’ s Pancake 
House and enjoy any one of 
their many taste tempting 
dishes in the most pleasant 
of friendly surroundings.

situation with the utmost o f 
reliability and repute.

The next time you are in 
town shopping, stop by and 
let them show you the 
exciting world o f coin 
collecting. You w ill be 
surprised at how easily and 
inexpensively you can get 
started.

The authors o f this 1975 
Review salute this reputable 
dealer for his honest and 
sincere business efforts, and 
recommend that our readers 
contact Ray’ s Coins And 
Stamps O f Amarillo for all 
phases o f the coin collecting 
hobby.

Dale’s Paint 
and Body Shop
Dale Rush-Owner
The personnel at this firm 

are specialists in body and 
fender work as well as auto 
painting. The place to have 
our car body rebuilt or 
painted is at the Dale’s Paint 
Sc Body Shop located at 1220 
E. 10th in Amarillo. Phone 
883-1651.

The owner o f this firm fully 
understands auto body and 
fender repair work. Whether 
it is a small or a large job, 
you will receive the same 
courteous treatment and 
professional workmanship.

This is one o f the best 
known auto body repair 
shops in this section because 
o f its excellent workmanship 
and service.

M ost insurance policies 
now permit you to choose the 
repair shop you like best. 
Select them to do your work. 
Their body work as well as 
auto painting is among the 
best done in this section. 
They have the “ know how”  
that puts their work in a class 
by itself.

The narrators o f this 1975 
Review recommend you to 
see the Dale’ s Paint Sc Body 
Shop for all work o f this type.

Superior Car Wash
George & Hazel 

Halnes-Owners
Take the work out o f 

washing your car by having it 
done with modern equipment 
at the Superior Car Wash at 
2608 South Georgia in 
Amarillo, phone 355-2131.

Save time and money on 
car washing by visiting this 
fine firm the next time you 
are in town.

You’ll enjoy the ease of 
having the work done by 
fully-automated, modern car 
washing equipment. Road 
tar and other harmful grime 
are removed from your car’ s 
finish in about five minutes. 
Ask about their special care 
car services.

Attendants here are court­
eous and see that your car is 
handled as carefully as if it 
were their own. Your car’ s 
cleanliness is the business of 
this establishment. The 
management has built a fine 
reputation by serving the 
public honestly and provid­
ing a fine service.

The writers o f this 1975 
Review  recommend the 
Superior Car Wash.

CandS
Electric Company
“ Featuring Sales 

On Forney 
Welding 

Machines”
Bill Hatley-Manager

The C And S Electric 
Company located at 1717 
East 10th in Amarillo, phone 
374-4898 is equipped to 
render you a complete 
electric motor, transformer, 
and generator service, as 
well as offering the finest in 
repair o f all types o f welding 
machines.

This concern's knowledge 
of electric motor repair work 
was received in the vast but 
greatly specialized school of 
experience and personal 
contact with the public. 
When you have electric 
motor repair work to be 
done, you can rest assured 
that it w ill receive the 
attention o f qualified per­
sonnel and the best service 
when taken to this firm. Thev 
use only the bejt in quality 
materials. So from a stand­
point to thoroughness, the 
policies o f this reliab le 
company are the best 
possible to be secured.

Nothing in the way o f an 
electrical motor is too small 
for them and there are few 
too large.

It is with great pleasure 
that we, the writers of this 
1975 Review  call your 
attention to this progressive 
concern, and suggest that 

. you make this your head­
quarters for electric motor 
work. m

Ml Star Sheet 
Metal and Roofing

Bob Hick* T Im  
Owner Hat 

Recently Gone 
Into The Roofing 
Business & Can 

Supply Your 
Needs In 

Resldontal- 
Commercial & 

Industrial Roofs

The All Star Sheet Metal Sc 
Roofing, located at 305 So. 
Bowie in Amarillo, phone 
372-6621, features general 
sheet metal work, guttering, 
and ventilating.

This firm has made a i 
exhaustive study o f the 
roo fing problems o f this 
particular area and has 
looked over the entire field o f 
roofing as presented by the 
various manufacturers. They 
have selected rriost artistic 
lines o f roofing and will be 
glad to go over any property 
you may have in mind and 
aid you in the selection o f a 
design, color, and type that 
will be the most durable and 
attractive for your needs.

Their years o f experience 
coupled with practical know­
ledge and knowhow have 
won for them an excellent 
reputation. When you con­
tract with this concern, you 
will receive the best that can 
be had, and at the same time 
ge t the most reasonable 
prices consistent with high 
quality work. Their aim is to 
do a top quality job that will 
sell itse lf to their next 
customer.

They are bonded and 
insured.

The developers o f this 
1975 Review urge you to 
remember the name the All 
Star Sheet Metal for quality 
wosk in both sheet metal and 
roofing.

RayneSoft 
Water Service

Joe Grimes-Owner
Rayne Soft Water Service 

is located at 507 South 
Alabama in Amarillo, phone
373-0271.

Since the beginning o f 
time, water has been as 
important as anv other one 
substance. Our bodies c any 
a higher percentage o f water 
than all other elem ents 
combined. Needless to say, 
good water is esentia! to 
good health.

Soft water is the surest 
way o f knowing you are also 
fighting pollution. This firm 
will be glad to explain the 
many advantages to reduce 
pollution by using soft water. 
It takes less detergents in 
cleaning and soft water also 
cuts down on heating costs.

The writers of this 1975 
Review issue would like to 
take this opportunity to 
stress the importance o f 
having a service o f this type 
available in our community. 
They will be glad to install 
and service a soft water 
system in your home. W e 
suggest you not wait another 
day, but telephone them and 
receive complete information 
on the soft water service this 
fine firm can offer you.

Amarillo Tent 
, and Awning
Mauwren Ellis 

-Owner
The Am arillo  Tent Sc 

Awning located at 707 S. 
Adams in Amarillo, phone 
373-1721 features awnings, 
and patio covers, custom 
designed lawn furniture, 
boat covers. Sc much more.

It is not necessary to go 
through another summer 
suffering from the heat in 
your home or business. This 
firm offers awnings that not 
only make your home several 
degrees cooler, but will make 
the exterior more beautiful.

PerBaps you are one of 
those persops who believes 
awnings are too expensive 
for the budget. It so, you are 
cordially invited to go by and 
they will be glad to give you 
an estimate on your needs. 
Find out the cost o f awnings 
and you will wonder why you 
haven't had them before 
now.

This concern will make 
awnings to fit your needs 
regardless of the type o f job. 
Why have a hot, uncom­
fortable home or business 
when you can remedy it? 
Employ the services o f the 
Amarillo Tent Sc Awning at a 
price you can afford.

In writing this 1975 
Review, we, the editors, take 
this time to commend and 
recommend this firm to all 
our readers.
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Stretch and Sew Fabric Center

Gack Radio and Television 
Service at 1609 S. Washing­
ton in Am arillo , phone 
372-1769 or 374-8221, can 
repair all makes o f TV sets. 
They have the technical 
knowledge to locate your 
television troubles rapidly, 
thus saving you money on 
your repair bill. Be sure to 
call this firm if vou would like 
skillfu lly tra ined men to 
repair you TV set properly 
and promptly.

They offer the people o f 
this community reliab le 
service at reasonable rates

Located at 1733 South 
Avondale in Amarillo phone 
355-8179 the Stretch And 
Sew Fabric Center can show 
you ladies who like to sew 
one of the largest selections 
o f fabrics o f every type that 
you’ ll find anywhere.

This shop has made it a 
point to survey the market 
and buy from only reputable 
mills who produce some o f 
the finest materials any­
where. Many o f the knits are

made exclusive for stretch 
and sew.

They have courteous 
friendly saleshelp who un­
derstand the needs o f the 
sewing person and can help 
you choose just the right 
material as well as give you 
tips on how to sew it up.

A long with their fine 
selection o f materials, this 
shop carries a complete line 
o f sewing notions, patterns, 
thread and zippers that will 
help you create a truly

distinctive garment.
The writers o f this 1975 

Review suggest to anyone 
who has an interest in 
sewing, that they let the 
friendly people at the Stretch 
And Sew Fabric Center 
explain to you just how easy 
it is and how much money 
can be saved while enjoying 
this creative hobby. W e 
compliment this shop and its 
management for offering our 
ladies thid fine fabric store to 
shop in.

Robertson’s Market

A apd S Steel Buildings, Inc. 
of Amarillo

People o f this area 
recognize the name Robert­
son's Market located at 1000 
W. 10th in Amarillo phone 
372-7003 for their fine 
tasting, tender, reasonably 
priced meats.

Regardless o f whether you 
need a quarter or half of 
beef, or just need some for 
dinner that night, you can be 
assured that the meat you 
get will be cut properly, 
justly weighed and some of 
the most delicious you have 
ever tasted.

The management here has 
made it a point to serve the 
people of this area to the best 
o f his ab ility. This is 
evidenced by the fact that 
they have a large patronage 
o f regular customers.

In making this 1975 
Review, we, the authors, 
take this opportunity to make 
publick our salute to this fine 
establishment and recom ­
mend the Robertson’s Mar­
ket to our readers as the best 
place in town to get your 
meats.

When you need a new 
building for your farm or 
business, you usually need it 
“ yesterday.”

But try to tell that to most 
construction companies and 
it’ s like talking to a wall.

We, the authors o f this 
Review assure our readers 
that this won’t happen when 
they call A&S Steel Building 
o f Amarillo, phone 355-8253

at 5744 Canyon Dr., because 
the very essence o f their 
business is speed. They are 
distributors for the famous 
A&S buildings. These build­
ings can be planned, 
designed, delivered  and 
finished-out, far faster than 
any ordinary building and at 
a smaller cost in most cases.

The editors o f this 1975

Review recommend that you 
contact A&S Steel Buildings, 
Inc. O f Am arillo  for the 
fastest and most economical 
solution to your farm or 
business building problems. 
We know you’ ll be more than 
pleased with the service that 
this firm  renders to the 
farmers, businessmen, and 
homeowners throughout this 
entire area.

Hertner’s Camera Store
Mrs. Gretchen Hertner-Owner 

Roy Cates-Mgr.

Doche and Company
’50th Year at Same Location’

Earl H . Christian, Jr. And King Kendrick Owners3MI
bm
!|.iv Doche And Company, 
^-phone 373-4378, is located at 

406-412 South Buchanan, in 
Amarillo, offers a complete 
service in dry cleaning.

Appearance does make a 
difference, and people who 
realize this, keep their 
clothes looking the part by

having them cleaned and 
restored to their original 
freshness and style by this 
shop. They know by 
experience and science how 
to remove those spots that 
get on clothes in the most 
unexpected manner. To have 
those spots removed safely, 
send your clothes to Doche

And Company today.
Whether you have a dress, 

suit, or coat,.you’ll find this 
shop will clean it well.

In this 1975 Review we, 
the organ izers, wish to 
congratulate these veteran 
cleaners upon their success 
in serving this section well at 
all times.

One o f the most complete 
photographic equipment and 
dark room supply centers in 
this area is H ertner’ s 
Camera Store at 114 West 
6th, Downtown in Amarillo, 
phone 372-1111.

Bank-Americard & Mas- 
tercharge welcome here.

Camera bugs in this area 
know that for their supplies 
and equipment when it 
comes to anything around 
the photographic line that 
this is the place to go.

They carry the finest lines 
o f name brand merchandise 
that is all priced within 
reason. Their friendly sales

Southwestern Hearing Aids
Mike Clarke-Manager

As your local representa­
tive for the famous Dahlberg

Medley Equipment Company The Original Candle Shop
“ Yale industrial Trucks & Nutting Floor 

Trucks And Casters”

“ Sales Service And Or Rentals”  

Monte Thomason-Manager
;; Trucks to meet every need 
tfre available in this area at 

,fn»e

‘Largest Selection In The Golden Spread”  
Betty Adams-Owner

M ed ley Equipment 
Company at 1501 Northeast 
3rd in Am arillo , phone 
374-5345. The fine line of 
Yale and Nameo industrial 
forklifts, K D Rough Terra in 
fork lifts, floor trucks and 
Masters, Cooperloy dock 
board equipment, railroad 
boards, mobile yard ramps, 
speed rack pallette rack, all 

’"types o f conveyer systems. 
Industrial and livestock 
scales. A  complete line o f 
attachments and accessories 
are sold here. Call 373-5345 
for information.

Different kinds of trucks 
needed to performare

special tasks. Whether it be 
for the farm or industry, 
you ’ ll find the type o f 
heavy-duty truck you need 
here.

Terms are reasonable and 
prices are competitive at this 
firm which has built a fine 
reputation in this area for 
square dealing and quality 
products.

The best in parts and 
service are available here
too.

No stranger to the truck 
and equipment business in 
this area is the M edley 
Equipment Company. The 
editors o f this 1975 Review 
suggests that you contact 
this firm for your next truck.

This exciting Shop is 
located at 2621 W olflin  
Village in Amarillo, phone
352-0301.

From their seem ingly 
endless assortment of can­
dles, you will find what you 
need to satisfy any occasion.

They specialize in custom 
floral arrangements and 
candle rings, wall sconces 
and handle lots o f brass.

They keep in stock at all 
times the standard candle in 
many lengths and colors and 
for the person who is looking 
for something com pletely 
different, to be used as a real 
decorator piece, this shop 
has one o f the best selections 
anywhere.

Here, you will find that 
their sales help are always 
helpful and friendly and will 
gladly assist you in choosing

Gatlin’s Shoes and Clothing
John And Glandeen Shenk-Owners

When you shop for 
footwear, you want to find 
shoes that fit more than just 
your feet. Your shoes should 
fit the way you live, the way 

, you look, the way you act and 
the way you think.

One of the nicest ways to 
find elegant new shoes 
designed especially to com­
pliment your total ‘ ‘ life  
style,”  is to slip into the 
quality footwear on display at 
Gatlin's.

Here you will find friendly, 
helpful personnel who al­
ways do their best to show 
you the kind of footwear and 
clothing that you want for 
today’ s total image; name 
brands in men's apparel such 
as Vanheusen and Lee, for 
the women this store carries 
Ship And Shore, Fire 
Islander and Miss Elaine in 
Misses and Junior sizes.

So stop in at Gatlin’s the 
next time you’re in Amarillo.

They are located at 4123 
W est 34th in Fleetwood 
Center phone 352-2784. They 
carry only high quality brand 
name shoes (for the entire 
family) at prices you can 
afford. City Club for men, 
Personality for women, and 
Red Goose for the kids.

We, the editors o f this 
1975 Review suggest that 
you make this progressive 
shoe store headquarters for 
your “ life style" footwear.

just the right candle for the 
use you have in mind. They 
make the perfect gift.

The writers o f this 1975 
Review invite our readers to 
stop in and browse around. 
You’ ll not believe there were 
so many sizes, shapes, and 
colors o f beautiful candles. 
You'll find it to be one o f the 
most intriguing shops any­
where.

Amarillo
Fire Extinguisher 

Service
James Keith  Th e  
Owner Retired Af­
ter More Than 24 
Years of Distingu­
ished Service With 
Amarillo Fire Dept. 
To Devote Full Tim e
To T h i.  important Shamrock Cleaners
Service!

Security Federal Savings and 
Loan Association

a Look For Our New Office Opening In 
Hereford In The Park Plaza Shopping 
Center”

This prominent savings 
and loan association has two 
locations in Amarillo to serve 
you,^ at 1501 South Polk, 
phone 376-4121 and 4300 
West 45th, phone 355-9436. 
The people in Pampa will 
find their Security Federal at 
W est Francis and Gray, 
phone 665-2326.

Let Security Federal ex­
plain the many advantages 
an account with a savings 
bank can offer, whether your 
needs are just savings or 
mortgage money for a home

or home improvement.
Security Federal Saving* 

And Loan Association was 
founded by men of character 
and integrity who were very 
prominent in business and 
commercial activities and has 
progressed as this area itself 
has grown and progressed. It 
is the largest and oldest 
savings and loan ass’n. in the 
High- Plains area, with 
assests o f more than 
$130,000,000.

Under the management of 
efficient and capable trust­
ees, they invite accounts of

all people who desire 
profitable service with a 
modern banking institution.

At this savings and loan 
ass’n. you will find strength, 
seasoned judgment, depend­
ability, accuracy in handling 
details and breadth of vision 
all to the management o f 
your personal affairs.

In making this 1975 
Review , we, the writers, 
wish to make the statement 
that at Security Federal you 
may at all times bank with 
safety.

For Peace o f mind in your 
home or business make sure 
you have the proper type of 
fire protection system. Also, 
make sure your equipment is 
properly serviced so that it 
will be serviceable in the 
advent o f an emergency. Mr. 
Keith now has available 
safety first automatic kitchen 
systems.

Sales and service o f 
indispensable fire protection 
systems are available in this 
area at the Amarillo Fire 
Extinguisher Service in 
Amarillo at 1812 E. 27th St.

Telephone 373-3019 for 
complete information on the 
latest, most modern type of 
equipment for business, 
industry and home.

C a rb on -d io x id e  e x t in ­
guisher are commonly used 
in the home and can be used 
on most types o f fires 
including those involving 
electrical equipment. Inquire 
at the Am arillo  Fire 
Extinguisher Service about 
these and other types of 
extinguishers, systems and 
safe guards.

The writers of this 1975 
Review recommend that you 
contact this firm for fire 
protection equipment sales 
and service.

Darrell
Cooper-Owner
A .D . Newman 

-Manager
Located at 2505 Line in 

Amarillo, phone 373-0208. 
Here the best in dry cleaning 
is accomplished. They use 
the best and latest processes, 
and as a consequence, when 
garments are returned to 
you, they are clean, odorless, 
and well pressed.

They specialize in all 
classes of dry cleaning for 
ladies and men, and the most 
delicate dresses are handled 
in a very careful manner.

They offer a fast shirt 
service, reweaving and 
drapery cleaning, and you’ ll 
like their friendly, courteous 
personnnel.

Many people have learned 
that through good dry 
cleaning service they can 
save the expenditure o f many 
dollars o f new clothing. Both 
men and women have found 
that the most sensitive 
fabrics are carefully handled 
and successfully cleaned at 
the Shamrock Geaners and 
are returned to them cleaned 
and finished in the finest 
manner.

This 1975 Review makes 
special commendation to this 
fine cleaners.

along with expert workman­
ship to please you. They 
guarantee their work and you 
may rest assured that they 
will replace only those parts 
which are actually needed.

Remember a television set 
is a very delicate instrument 
and only experienced repair­
men know how to handle 
them without dam aging 
them. In this 1975 Review 
Issue we, the editors, highly 
recommend this televis ion  
repair shop for professional 
Color TV repair at low cost.

The A & A  D rilling Co. 
located at 8040 River Drive in 
Am arillo , phone 383-6818 
has been able to effectively 
find water at low cost in this 
area for several years.

D rilling a good, long 
producing water well is not a 
job for the amateur. The 
knowledge and experience 
behind this well driller will 
prove valuable after you note 
that the well he has drilled 
has produced for some time, 
there have been no cave-ins, 
and that large enough pipe 
was installed with a strong 
pump that provides the

amount o f water you need.
They use late model 

equipm ent and trained 
assistants who also under­
stand their work, and you can 
be assured that the job will 
be completed in the shortest 
time, at the least expense, 
and with the very smallest 
damage to your property.

The editors o f this 1975 
Review  make public our 
recommendation o f this well 
driller for his fine work, and 
suggest our readers remem­
ber to contact the A& A  
Drilling Co. whenever they 
need a good well at low cost.

T. J. Carter Custom Tree Service
A dying or dead tree can 

cause considerable damage 
or even present a threat to 
life in the event o f a storm. 
Don’ t let this situtation 
threaten your property and 
safety. Removing dangerous 
trees is a specialty o f the T.J. 
Carter Custom Tree Service 
at 1610 South Monroe in 
Amarillo phone 373-4593.

The specialize in complete 
tree spraying and weed

killing and weed control.
Com plete tree care is 

available from  this firm  
including spraying, removal, 
cabling, pruning, topping, 
bracing, trimming and land 
clearing.

These qualified tree sur­
geons can do the job you 
need.

Estimates are given and 
the firm  makes its tree 
experts available anywhere

in this area. Com plete 
equipment for every job is 
carried on prom ptly dis 
patched trucks.

Don’t put yourself out on a 
limb. Compare the prices. 
Compare the services. Let 
the professionals at T.J. 
Carter Custom Tree Service 
do the job.

This 1975 Review and its 
writers recommend this firm 
for complete tree care.

W. C. Roberts Lumber Co.

people are fully aware o f the 
facts about all o f the 
equipment they offer and will 
be more than happy to help 
you select just the right 
equipment or supplies for 
your needs regardless o f 
whether you are just an 
amateur photographer or 
professional.

The editing staff o f this 
1975 Review extend our foil 
endorsement to this company 
for their fair service and fine 
business policies. W e re­
commend that our readers 
make h a point to stop at 
Hertner’s Camera Store for 
all o f their photographic 
needs.

The W .C. Roberts Lumber 
Co. located at 6001 Canyon 
Drive, phone 352-2757, are 
suppliers o f a complete line 
o f lumber, building supplies, 
bu ilder’ s hardware, and 
tools.

This company has long 
been considered to be one o f 
the leading dealers in lumber 
and buildiang materials, and 
offers you a complete “ One 
Stop Building Service.”

This firm has been an 
important factor in the 
expansion, growth, and 
development o f this com­
munity, and the policy o f this 
firm  has always been a 
determination to supply the 
highest grade o f lumber and 
building m aterials at a 
reasonable price. Contrac­
tors and the public in general 
have learned that whatever 
they desire in the lumber o f

builders supply line, can be 
obtained from this firm.

The compilers o f this 1975 
Review are pleased to assure 
our readers that at the 
hands o f this firm, they will 
receive the best o f service, 
and they extend a personal 
invitation to the people o f 
this section to call at their 
office at any time to discuss 
proposed building plans.

Wayne’s Barbeque
“ The Worlds Finest BQ House Featuring 
World Famous BQ Spare-Ribs & Beans.”

Wayne Wheelock-Owner

hearing aids, the Southwest­
ern Hearing Aids located at 
2414 West 8th in Amarillo, 
phone 355-5282, o ffers  a 
hearing aid for every 
electron ically correctable 
hearing loss.

Through their conscienti­
ous efforts to make sure that 
every person they fit with a 
hearing aid is properly fitted, 
a complete audiometric test 
and evaluation is made for 
each person.

Dahlberg hearing ajds 
have been long in the testing 
laboratories to make sure 
that when a person is fitted 
with any o f their models, it 
w ill be as com plete as 
possible to correct their 
hearing problem.

You will enjoy discussing 
your hearing problem with 
their courteous representa­
tive, Mike Garke, who is 
thoroughly schooled and well 
trained in the perfect fitting 
o f hearing aids.

The writers o f this 1975 
Review suggest to the people 
who have a hearing problem 
that they contact the 
Southwestern Hearing Aids. 
You can be assured o f fair 
treatment and an honest 
value. W e commend them 
for the fine service they offer 
to our people and salute their 
fa ir and ethical business 
practices.

World famous for their 
delicioMS barbecued foods, 
Wayne’ s Barbeque is located 
at 3207 S. W estern  in 
Amarillo phone 352-3221. ** 

People from miles around 
frequent this unique house o f 
fine barbecued food specialt­
ies. Their menu is one o f the 
most exciting you ’ ll find 
anywhere, the fo o d 1 they 
service is equally delicious.

In an atmosphere you can 
relax and enjoy, friend ly 
people, they will serve you in 
the most courteous and polite 
manner.

This B Q House specilizes 
in delicious B Q Sandwiches, 
spareribs and beans.

In their clean, modern 
kitchen, their food is 
prepared by experts in the

art o f fine cuisine, and out o f 
only the highest quality of 
foods.

The editing staff o f this 
1975 R ev iew  take this 
opportunity to g ive  our 
wholehearted recommenda­
tion to this fine restaurant for 
delicious food and friendly 
service, and suggest that our 
readers enjoy a meal soon at 
Wayne’s Barbeque. -

Ditch Witch of West Texas, Inc.
Lenny Sadler-Manager

This w ell known firm , 
located in Amarillo at 8418 
Canyon Drive, phone 353- 
6683, is the dealer for the

popular Ditch Witch line o f 
trenchers, backhoes, and 
vibratory plows with four 
wheel drive and hydraulic

Wish Bone Restaurant
“ If The Colonel Had Our Recipe-He’d Be 
A  General”

Bob Noonan-Mgr.
such delicious chicken at 
such fair prices. Try them for 
real service and good food, 
and we are sure you will tell 
your friends about them.

The owner is proud o f his 
establishment and has good 
reason to be.

There is a good reason for 
th Wish Bone Restaurant 
located at 3601 Am arillo  
Blvd. E. in Amarillo being so 
popular. The chicken orders 
served here have real 
“ pulling power”  and draw 
lovers o f fine chicken for 
many miles around. It ’ s 
better than eating at home.

H ere you w ill find a 
friendly atmosphere. Your 
orders will receive prompt 
attention and everyth ing 
served you will be o f the best 
quality. It isn’ t often that we 
can find a restaurant serving

Stop hunting for that good 
place to eat while you are in 
town. Stop here and you’ll 
have found it.

The organizers of this 1975 
Review unhesitatingly give 
our full endorsement to the 
Wish Bone Restaurant.

Ben H. Stokes Bail Bond Service
Ben H . Stokes-Surety

Call 376-4205 for 24 hour experience with bail bonds.
service on bail bonds.

In this day and age many 
innocent people are jailed 
and in this dire emergency, a 
bail bondsman is an 
invaluable asset and friend to 
have.

No- amount o f 'effort is 
spared to give you the fasted 
service and the customers of 
this concern are delighted 
with the service which they 
receive.

The owner o f this 
business, has had a long

and is thoroughly competent 
in every respect. His advice, 
in matters pertaining to. 
bonding is sought after and 
respected. They offer the 
people o f this area a 24 hour 
service and are always 
available to serve you. * 

We, the writers, o f this 
1975 Review, are not often 
able to g ive  the whole 
hearted recommendation to 
any firm we give the Ben H. 
Stokes Bail Bond Service at 
319 East 6th in Amarillo.

North Amarillo Auto Salvage
Fred Robinson And Paul Smith-Owners
For used auto parts go to 

the North Am arillb Auto 
Salvage located at 5002 River 
Rd. in Am arillo . Phone 
383-9141.

Many do not realize the 
value o f an auto wrecking 
concern to the community. 
They wUl pay the highest 
price for your old worn out 
auto, or one that has been in 
a wreck. Let them take it to 
their place o f business where 
they will start working on it. 
Engines, transmissions, 
parts and accessories are 
segregated into piles and the 
car body is placed in a 
specified section o f the yard 
to be used for used body

parts.
Many dollars may be 

saved in parts if purchased at 
the North Am arillo  Auto 
Salvage. You will find all of 
their parts for sale in good 
condition and com pletely 
checked over. A ll their 
employees are familiar with 
automobiles and trucks, and 
are courteous and accom- 
moding. See them for auto 
parts, or whenever you have 
an automobile that is no 
longer in running condition 
to sell.

The authors of this 1975 
Review take this time to 
endorse this wrecking yard of 
fair and honest dealing.

features. Be sure you see this 
firm before you purchase 
your farm equipment. They 
have had years o f experience 
in furnishing just the right 
machine for the job.

When you buy ditching 
equipment, you want to know -  
that you are getting 
machines that will stand up 
to the job. This equipment 
has stood the test for years.
It can be depended upon to 
give the maximum service 
per dollar invested.

We, the compilers of this 
1975 Review, wish to point 
out the fine reputation Ditch 
Witch O f West Texas, Inc. 
has built. They are noted for 
square dealings and will 
stand behind every pur­
chase. Drop in and see the 
new models the next time 
you are in -the area.

Stockman’s 
Saddle Shop

Bob Marrs-Owner

You will find the finest 
custom made saddles and 
leather goods in this area at 
Stockman’s Saddle Shop in 
Amarillo located at 2710 East 
3rd. Telephone 372-8439 and 
learn about their competitive 
prices.

Made to order saddles«are 
featured here with first grade 
saddle skirting for durability 
and comfort. They are hand 
crafted by h ighly skilled 
saddle makers assuring you 
o f the finest quality avail­
able.

A com plete line o f 
accessories and other leather 
goods are also sold at this 
establishment. Here you’ ll 
find bits, spurs, bridles and 
other items.

They have built a fine 
reputation in this area by 
selling only high quality 
merchandise.

For saddles and accessor­
ies, this 1975 Review and its 
composers believes you will 
enjoy doing business with 
this reputable firm. This is 
why we suggest you make 
them your headquarters for 
all leather goods and 
accessories.

Also in conjunction with 
the saddle shop, you will find 
the finest in western art, at 
the Cowboy A rt Gallery, 
telling the story o f the West 
in oils and water colors.
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J. Lee Milligan, Inc. Time Chemical and Janitor Supply
J. Lee M illigan , Inc., 

located at 9200 Triangle in 
Amarillo, phone 373-4386 are 
contractors for all types of 
asphalt paving including 
driveways, streets, parking 
lots, etc.

When you have paving 
laid, you want it to be 
durable and last for years. 
There is a great deal o f skill 
required to lay a paving 
properly and when you

Amarillo Auto Salvage, Inc.
“ Top Prices Paid For Your Junk Autos" 

Fred Cariker-President
The Amarillo Auto Salv­

age, Inc. is located in 
Amarillo at S106 Amarillo 
Blvd., phone 374-4447. They 
will pay top prices for your 
junked, burned, and wrecked 
car bodies.

Through all periods o f 
economic fluctuation this 
firm has always been ready 
to serve the best interests of 
the general public o f this

area. They have derived 
more than the mere profit as 
measured by dollars and 
cents because there has been 
a real and genuine satis­
faction to this firm to be able 
to render this service.

A business o f this kind is 
essential to the entire area. 
By fair and honest methods 
they have gained the

confidence and patronage o f 
the people o f this commun­
ity.

A fine spirit o f cooperation 
has always been in every 
transaction with this firm and 
we, the w riters o f this 
Review, wish to compliment 
them, and suggest you 
contact them soon to help get 
rid o f your junk cars and you 
can make a profit.

Texas Electric of Amarillo
City and county ordinances 

affecting electric wiring o f all 
bu ildings and homes are 
defin ite ly strenuous. The 
purpose, however, is evi­
dent. Many disastrous fires 
and home accidents are the 
result o f defective wiring. 
For these reasons, it is 
im perative that everyone 
needing electrica l w iring, 
insist upon the services o f a 
competent, licensed electri-

Wayne Wallis-Owner

cian, who is qualified to do 
work.

The Texas E lectric O f 
Am arillo  at 3008 South 
Pierce in Am arillo  phone 
372-6789 is a local firm o f 
licensed electricians. Few 
persons in this line o f work 
can boast o f so many years o f 
competent and skilled ser­
vice to the residents o f this 
area. They have established .

I

an enviable reputation 
throughout the entire field o f 
electrical contracting and has 

roved itself worthy o f the 
aith and patnpnage o f our 
people. For all your electrical 
problems as well as power, 
commercial, and residential 
wiring, see this firm.

The writers o f the 1975 
Review  recommends the 
Texas Electric O f Amarillo to 
all our many readers.

Farmland Industries, Inc.
“ Owned And Operated By The Farmers 

Who Use Their Services"
One o f the concerns upon 

which the ranchers o f our 
community depend a great 
deal is the Local Double 
Circle Co-op. This firm has 
been a friend to the fanner 
for many years and has made 
a host o f friends throughout 
this area.

They are rendering a 
service o f benefit to the 
people throughout our trad­

ing area. They are dealers in 
farm supplies, fuels, fertiliz­
ers and feeds which will keep 
your livestock in the best of 
condition. They o ffe r a 
complete feed service to fill 
your every need.

Any information concern­
ing proper farm supplies can 
be had by inquiring from the 
Local Double Circle Co-op, 
all in keeping with their

Binswanger Glass Co.
The Binswanger Glass Co. 

located at 1009 W. 5th in 
Am arillo  phone 372-5511, 
offers the people o f this 
community glass for every 
occasion. They feature a foil 
line o f glass for windows, 
store fronts, desk tops, 
co ffee  tables, pictures, 
m irrors, and auto glass. 
Regardless o f what item you 
have that needs glass all you 
have to do is take the 
measurements and g ive

Tom Sawyer-Manager
them to them and they will 
cut it to your exact 
specifications.

Take an inventory in your 
home today and see what 
furniture yoq have that needs 
a glass top, or what broken 
windows need replacing. 
Take the measurements and 
on your next trip to-town, let 
them cut it to size while you 
wait.

The Binswanger Glass Co. 
carries a complete selection

o f auto and truck glass for 
most makes and models and 
will install it while you wait. 
Your complete satisfaction is 
guaranteed on all work and 
they specialize in insurance 
claims.

I f  you are considering 
some remodeling or build­
ing, let them give you an 
estimate on the job.

The writers o f this 1975 
Review  recommend this 
concern.

Williams Fruit Market
Known for their fine 

quality fresh fruits and 
vegetables in this area is the 
Williams Fruit Market locat­
ed at 3405 Amarillo Blvd. in 
Amarillo phone 374-8872.

This market has establish­
ed a fine reputation for only 
selling the highest quality o f 
produce that can be attained. 
All o f the fruits and vege­
tables they sell are purchas-

C.R. Williams-Owner

ed from farmers and growers 
they know and trust to raise 
only the best.

You’ll find they offer a 
wide variety year around at 
some o f the most realistic 
prices in town, and you’ ll be 
pleased with their friendly 
service.

They keep their products 
stored in the latest coolers 
and make sure that every­

thing they sell is pure and 
fresh.

It is the pleasure o f the 
writers o f this 1975 Review to 
announce our public salute to 
this fin e market and its 
managers for their efforts in 
serving our people w ell. 
Remember the name, the 
William’s Fruit Market. We 
know you’ll enjoy shopping 
here.

Best Western Villa Inn
If you’re in the mood for a 

vacation and find you don’t 
have quite enough cash for 
an extended trip, then take a 
“ weekend Holiday”  instead 
at the Villa Inn Motel in 
Amarillo.

The Villa Inn Motel offers 
* you all the ingredients o f a 

real holiday vacation. They 
have luxurious accomoda-

Walt Shuman-Manager
tions to please even the most 
discriminating, including: a 
beautiful indoor swimming 
pool, an exotic indoor 
tropical garden, and the Villa 
Inn Club. You’ ll be sure to 
enjoy yourself here.

Regardless o f your length 
of your stay, even if it’s just 
for dinner or cocktails, you

will always be welcome here.
In com piling this 1975 

Review we, the editors, feel 
it is indeed a pleasure to 
recommend the Villa Inn to 
all our readers. They are 
located at 3618 Interstate 40 
East (Grand Street Exit). 
Phone 372-3511 for reserva­
tions or additional informa­
tion.

G-P Manufacturing Company
“ Manufacturers Of The Orlgnal Chisel 
Plow"

M .B . Graham-President 
Bob Graham And Denton Smith-V.P.'s

This firm features Chisel 
plows in standard sizes and 
models from 5 to 50 feet. 
They are located 4 V4 Miles 
West from the city limits on 
Indian Hill Road in Amarillo, 
phone 355-9786.

Their products are super­
ior to many offered on the 
market today and the vast 
quantities they produce have 
greatly aided in the business 
life  o f the city and

surrounding communities.
It can readily be seen that 

thousands o f dollars are 
placed in local circulation by 
this, firm which otherwise 
would never become a 
stimulus in the business life 
of the people of this part of 
the state.

The large scale o f their 
activities, the industrial 
wisdom of the management 
and their straight forward 
dealings have won for them a

contract with this well 
thought o f contractor to do 
any work you can be assured 
o f an expert job and only the 
best in materials.

If you have a dirt driveway 
or parking lot that is always 
muddy and hard to get in and 
out o f when it runs, call 
them for an estimate to have 
it laid with paving that will 
last. They will complete their

contract in the shortest time

Sble and you need not be 
venienced in having to 
wait a long time in getting 

your work done.
In this 1975 Review we, 

the editors, take great 
pleasure in highly recom­
mending J. Lee Milligan, 
Inc. to all our readers. When 
you need a first class paving 
contractor, be sure to call 
this reputable contractor.

Murrell G . Latimer-Pres. Mike Boyd-Vice Pres.
Look to the name of the 

Tim e Cemical A  Janitor 
Supply located at 612 North 
Polk in Am arillo  phone 
376-5291 fo r the highest 
quality janitor supply and 
equipment sales and rental. 
Including: Johnson W ax 
products, advance floor 
m ach ines, e le c tro m a g ic  
steam cleaners, and hi„h 
pressure washer. Steelcote

place in the hearts o f the 
people o f the community in 
which their lu ge  establish­
ment is located.

The editors o f this 1975 
Review  are pleased to 
compliment the G-P Manu­
facturing Company for their 
progressive activities and 
upon the leading position 
they occupy in the business 
world o f this section o f the 
state.

Maaco Auto Paint and Body
“ A  Quality Job At A  Quality Price"

[1 to 2 Day Service]
215 S. Taylor, Phone 372-3446

AAmco Automatic Transmissions
The AAm co Automatic 

Transm issions, located at 
308 S. Pierce in Amarillo, 
phone 376-5906, gives expert 
service on all makes o f 
automatic or standard trans­
missions; rebuild, exchang­
ed, or repaired.

When your transmission 
needs repair service or 
replacement, it is logical for 
you to obtain the services of a 
shop that specializes in this 
integral part o f your cu . 
AAm co Autom atic Trans­
missions knows the various

376-5906 308 S. Pierce
parts and their functions and 
their expert transmission 
specialist are able to repair, 
rebuild, or recommend and 
exchange if it should be 
necessary.

You can now get “ quality 
painting at a quality price” . 
The AAmco Auto Painting, 
located at 215 S. Taylor in 
Am arillo , phone 372-3446 
offers a 1 to 2 day service on 
most jobs. AAmco special­
izes in auto paiting and 
repair o f auto bodies and

fenders. They have a wide 
selection o f paints from 
which to choose from, or they 
can blend paint so that it will 
match your car perfectly. If 
you are having your car. This 
firm  has the finest in 
equipment and experience 
and is capable o f giving your 
car a paint job equal to the 
one it had when it come from 
the factory.

The compilers o f this 1975 
R eview , recommend the 
AAmco & Maaco to all our 
readers.

Jack C. Thomas and Son

policy to render every service 
possible to their patrons. It 
has been their aim to offer 
reliable products at honest 
prices.

Contact your Local Double 
C ircle Co-op fo r more 
information.

From this 1975 Review we, 
the narrators, happily re­
commend this company to 
our readers.

Located at 406 S. Adams 
in Amarillo phone 373-4863 
is the Jack C. Thomas ft Sons 
Painting Contractor, a paint­
ing contractor well known in 
this area for his ethical 
business dealings.

Regardless o f whether you 
need residential, industrial, 
or comm ercial interior or 
exterior paint contracting 
done, this is the firm to call.

Painting Contractor
Their experience in this 

field has given them the 
know how to handle any size 
job.

Unlike so many painters, 
this firm completely prepares 
the surface to be painted so 
that the job will be attractive 
and long lasting. You can be 
sure that they will complete 
the job on schedule and at 
the lowest prices possible for

A and L Saw Service
Glen McCormick-Owner

Don’t delay getting that 
much needed saw sharpen­
ed. Take it to the A&L $'aw 
Service at 305 Browning in 
Amarillo today.

Telephone 374-2392. The 
rates for this outstanding 
service are very reasonable 
and competitive with others 
in this area. But the service 
and quality o f work offered 
by this form far surpasses

what most saw sharpeners 
offer.

For top performance from 
your saws and related 
equipment, you should have 
them serviced and sharpened 
regularly.

No long and costly waits 
are involved when you take 
your equipment to this 
business. Fast and efficient 
service has made this firm 
well known and respected in

Wagon Wheel Trailer Court
'M r. and Mrs. Orville Rader

One o f the best liked 
trailer parks in this area is 
the Wagon Wheel Trailer 
Court located at 7003 
Amarillo Blvd. in Amarillo 
phone 374-9082.

The residents o f this park 
have come to realize the 
carefree living they enjoy 
here. They find they have no 
land problems and can relax

in its private, quiet atmo­
sphere. This popular park 
features: clean patios, lots of 
shade and for those stormy 
evenings a storm cellar.

The park is located 
conveniently near schools 
and shopping facilities are 
just minutes away.

The management of this 
park has made it a point to 
keep it clean and well

Triple-T-WallBoard Contractors
The introduction o f dry 

wall construction in building 
is one o f the most important 
and tim e-saving develop­
ments since building began. 
In this area, call the 
Triple-T-Wallboard Contrac­
tor located at 340 Chapman 
Drive in Am arillo , phone 
355-3282.

Methods o f building con­
struction have been con-

Colby Tidwell-Owner
stantly improved since the 
first crude structures. The 
smooth, sturdy and adapt­
able dry wall contraction has 
been a boon to the borne 
building and rem odeling 
business.

Call them to learn about 
the reasonable rates for dry 
wall installation. Complete 
dry wall service is offered 
here including installation, 
taping, and texturing.

Expert w ork '' is the 
standard o f this Tine 
contracting firm. No job is 
too large or too small and 
service if  offered anywhere 
in this area.

The compilers o f this 1975 
Review  unhesitatingly re­
commends the Trip le-T- 
W allboard Contractors for 
dry wall contracting in this 
area.

Dulaney Used Parts
With the price o f auto 

parts as high as they are 
today, the average person 
cannot affori to keep his car 
in the best o f repair, unless 

.  he is a wise owner and saves 
his money by selecting his 
parts from the Dulaney Used 
Parts located at 6600 Canyon 
in Amarillo phone 352-2713.

, They are experts in their 
field and can help you select

just the right part to fit any 
particular project. They keep 
in stock a complete line of 
good used engines, and with 
their use you can save many 
dollars over having your 
present engine overhauled.

From generators and 
alternators to transmissions 
both standard and automatic 
this firm can supply you with 
practically any part you 
might need. They never sell

Artistic School of Hairdressing
The Artistic School O f 

Hairdressing is located at 
800 West 16th in Amarillo 
phone 373-2853. They find a 
way to dignified employment 
for women in this and 
surrounding counties.

Attention to all you -girls 
living in this area, i f  you can 
call in person you will be 
advised a *t to personal 
requirements, as well as the

Cora Crain-Ownar
cost o f an length o f the 
course. They will be glad to 
explain all phases of the 
training course to you. 
Graduates of this school are 
employed in the finest shops 
in the state. Their supervi­
sion and training is backed 
by years o f experience.

This Beauty Culture School 
features reasonable rates so

Industrial paints and all 
types o f cleaning chemicals, 
with free delivery in the 
Tri-State area.

Helping to keep America 
beautiful, this firm strives to 
keep in stock the latest in 
modern, efficient equipment 
and supplies. This merchan­
dise is available on purchase 
plans or can be rented on low 
daily, weekly, and monthly 
rates.

Their experienced per­
sonnel can help you choose 
the right equipment and 
chemicals for the job, and 
will be more than happy to 
assist you in using them as

They carry only name 
brand products used by 
thousands o f people who 
know they wiO get the fob 
done quickly and at a low 
coat.

It is with these above facts 
that we, the editors o f this 
1975 Review, make public 
our foil endorsement o f this 
concern and suggest to our 
readers that they remember 
the name the Tune Chemical 
A  Janitor Supply for friendly 
service and high quality 
products at reasonable 
pricea.

Palo Duro Heating 
and Air Conditioning

The purpose o f a building 
is to protect us from the 
weather. Unless it protects 
us from the weather year 
around, it is not a modern 
building. In regards to year 
around air conditioning, 
most o f us are living in 
houses or working in 
buildings not up with the 
modern times in which we 
live.

With a Carrier year around 
air conditioner, you set the 
thermostat for either heating 
or cooling and you have 
spring the whole year.

I f  you have a central 
furnace, you likely have half 
an air conditioning system 
already and do not realize it. 
Call today for an estimate o f 
the low cost o f enjoying year 
around air conditioning. Let 
them furnish you a personal 
survey with all the pertinent 
facts and figures. See Palo 
Duro Heating And A ir  
Conditioning located at 3312 
West 45th in Amarillo, phone 
355-8974.

The writers o f this 1975 
Review recommend this firm 
for their fine service and 
expert workmanship.

quality work.
For a first rate job in 

painting from a reliable firm, 
the narrators o f this 1975 
Review  suggest to our 
readers that they contact the 
Jack C. Thomas ft  Sons 
Painting Contractor. W e 
know that you’ll be more 
than pleased with the 
professional manner o f their 
work.

Ronnie Kellum 
Quarter Horses

Ronnie Kellum-Owner

this region.
A dull saw is o f little use to 

a man when he has a job that 
needs to be done immediate­
ly-

For saw sharpening and 
repairing, the A ftL  Saw 
Service is recommended by 
the writers o f this 1975 
Review. They also feature 
complete repairing on all 
makes o f chain saws.

This area’ s best in horse 
training is available in 
Am arillo  at 4022 Spark, 
Dumas Hwy. and West 
Hastings, phone 383-9833, 
by Ronnie Kellum.

Ronnie Kellum  is o ri­
ginally from Amarillo but he 
has been train ing ia 
Australia for the last 5 years. 
He specializes in the training 
o f your cutting horses and 
race horses and is an expert 
in these fields. He also has 
many fine horses for sale at 
this time.

They have had years of 
experience in this field and 
will give your animal tip top 
train ing at modest rates. 
This stable specializes in 
training horses for the show 
ring but will also break, 
teach riding, basic horse­

manship, and w ill teach 
groups or give individual 
lessons to the aspiriag 
horseman or horsewoman, 
and will break and train for 
racing.

The stable facilities here 
are modern, clean and 
comfortable. Light, dry, well 
ventilated stalls will assort 
you that your animal remains 
healthy and will be com­
fortable.

We, the composers o f this 
1975 Review  remind our 
readers to rem em ber the 
name Ronnie Kellum Quar­
ter Horses for excellent horse 
training, expert riding in­
struction and the best in 
boarding.

W e compliment the owner 
on his fin e upstanding
policies. -

Hawbaker’s Auction
Dean And Betty Hawbaker-Owners

maintained. You will find 
their rates low and your 
neighbors friendly.

I f  you are looking for a 
good place to park your 
trailer, or mobile home, we, 
the designers o f this 1975 
Review highly recommend 
the Wagon Wheel Trailer 
Court. W e know you’ll enjoy 
living in this pleasant park.

H awbaker’ s Auction is 
located in Amarillo at 1211 
South Lincoln. Phone 373- 
8134.

This well known auction 
company has served the 
farmers and town folk o f this 
community faithfully and 
honestly.

They sell complete stocks 
of merchandise at auction 
and will assure you o f more 
money for your merchandise. 
They have years o f experi­
ence in this business and 
know how to conduct a 
profitable and interesting 
sale.

To be successful, an 
auctioneer must be well liked 
by the people in the 
community where he works. 
The men connected with this 
firm are well thought of and 
very popular in the sur­
rounding counties. Remem­
ber this, when you have 
merchandise you would like 
to sell, be sure to contact 
Hawbaker’ s Auction.

In this 1975 Review issue, 
we, the editors, would like to 
draw your attention to the 
need of a successful and 
reliable auctioneer in every 
community.

Baker and Taylor Drilling Co.
Max E. Banks-Pres.

Roy Bulls-V.P. & Sec.
Don G. Bowie-V.P. & Trees.
R.W . Brandt-V.P. of Drilling 

Chester Lamber-V.P. Contracts
The Baker ft Taylor been said that business goes

parts they know are worn out 
or damaged without first 
telling you the condition of 
what you buy.

We, the writers -of this 
1975 Review suggest to our 
readers that they save their 
money by selecting good 
used parts from this reliable 
concern. Remember the 
name, the Dulaney Used 
Parts.-

Drilling Co. specializes in oil 
well drilling.

This firm is one o f the 
leaders o f its kind in this area 
and has built its reputation 
upon service,' satisfaction 
and the good will o f its many 
satisfied customers. Having 
been in this line of business 
for a number of years, they 
know the demands o f his 
customers and furnishes 
quality service at reasonable 
prices.

People throughout the 
petroleum industry are doing 
business with them because 
they know they w ill be 
treated fairly. It has often

where it is invited and stays 
where it is well treated. That 
accounts in a very large 
measure for the success and 
popularity o f the Baker & 
Taylor Drilling Co., the main 
office is at 712 1st. Nat’ l 
Bank Bldg, in Am arillo , 
phone 373-8307 or Spear- , 
man. 659-2504 and Cana­
dian. phone 323-5343.

In this 1975 Review we. 
the editors of it. in making 
mention o f the reliab le 
concerns in our trade 
territory, wish to thank the 
Baker ft Taylor Drilling Co. 
for helping find new energy 
to keep America strong.

drop in for a shampoo ami set 
and talk with them about 
enrolling in their school. You 
too can make good money in 
this type o f work. They are 
also members of the National 
Association of Cosmetology 
Schools.

We, the writers o f the 1975 
Review, suggest you call the 
Artistic School O f Hairdres 
sing for all Information.
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Fun After 
Fifty Club

After the lunch on lu t  
W ednesday, twenty-seven 
senior citizens had their eyes 
tested for Glaucoma. There 
were three who had signs of 
glaucoma and were told to 
see their doctors. Too bad
more people d idn ’ t take

Dr. Caldwell Receives Highest 
Medical Foundation Award

Kim Hortea, daughter o f Mr. and Mrs. Barney Horton, presented the 1975 senior class and 
spectators the valedictory address Friday night at commencement ceremonies held in the 
Clarendon College fine arts building. The graduation ceremonies received extremely heavy 
attendance, with the crowd filling the aisles and spilling into the reception area o f the 
auditorium.

In commencement exer­
cises held on Saturday, May 
24, at 8 p.m . in the 
McDermott Plaza, Turner M. 
Caldwell, III, son o f Mr. and 
Mrs. T.M . Caldwell, Jr., was 
graduated from Southwest­
ern Medical School, Dallas, 
with the highest honor that 
can be accorded a graduate.

He was recipient o f the Ho 
Din Award of Southwestern 
Medical Foundation in re­
cognition o f medical wisdom 
and human understanding.

The award was presented 
by Mrs. Eugene McDermott, 
trustee, Southwestern Medi­
cal Foundation which auth­
orized the establishment of 
the award on May 5, 1943, to 
symbolized the fundamental 
concept on which the college 
was to be based. It is given 
upon recommendation o f the 
faculty and is accompanied 
by a cash prize o f SI,000 
from the Foundation.

Parkland Hospital, Dallas, 
then go to the University o f 
California Medical Center in 
San Francisco for a three 
year residency in dermato­
logy.

Tim received all o f his 
grade and high school 
education in Clarendon. He 
received his pre-m edical 
education at Southwestern 
University, Georgetown, 
Texas, where, among many 
other honors, he graduated 
at the top o f his class, summa 
cum laude, and was listed in 
Who’s Who among Ameri­
can Colleges and Universit­
ies. He, his wife Jane and 
daughter, Genny, will visit 
Clarendon before returning 
to Dallas.

advantage o f this free service 
performed by Dr. Gilkey on 
his afternoon off. The Center 
really apprecitates this 
service and also the nurses 
who help with the Health 
Program. Next Monday will 
be the free Blood Pressure 
test. Each time this test has 
been given some have been 
told to see their own doctor. 
The Center and the nurse are 
still working on the other 
tests planned to be given. 
With the shortage o f doctors, 
the Center feels its health 
program will be a great help 
to both the senior citizens 
and the doctors.

Those o f you are interested 
in art and carfts o f any kind 
may sign up at the Center 
any Monday Wednesday or 
Friday. Also different kinds 
o f knitting and crocheting 
classes are held on Tuesday 
afternoon from  2:00-4:00. 
The ladies are making stoles, 
turbans and afghans o f 
different stiches. Some who 
are knitting now haven’ t 
stopped knitting since they 
first learned and some are 
beginning again after over 
fifty years. I f  you have a new 
pattern, bring it on down and 
learn together.

The Center was represent-

Directors fo r the Texas 
Panhandle Community Act­
ion Corporation and to 
present 8SVP Volunteers to 
the Board. Tex Selvidge is a 
member o f the Board. Mr. 
Argus Burnett is the Director 
o f the Community Action. 
Representatives from Donley 
County Senior Citizens were 
Mr. and Mrs. W ill Corgill, 
Mr. and, Mrs. M el Mills and 
Sharon Mills. Sharon Mills 
does volunteer telephone 
reassurance for the center. It 
was very gra tify in g  that 
Clarendon was mentioned 
more than once.

the first tim e, w ill be 
interested in knowing it is a 
drop-in center and is located 
at 103 East Fourth. The 
Senior C itizens are the 
guests o f the Local Housing 
Authority. It is the thought­
fulness o f the Board and 
H om er Estlack that is 
appreciated. The center is 
opened from 9:00 a.m. to 
6:00 p.m. on Monday and 
Wednesday and 9 a.m. to 10 

m. on Friday. A  light lunch 
served on W ednesday 

noon for a donation o f 
seventy-five (75) cento 
more.

I f f

r;

or

For those o f you who may 
be reading about the Senior 
Citizens o f Donley County for

The coffee pot is always oniffeepot
or if you prefer iced tea and 
cookies, too.

v r

| lawns McKinney
CUSTOM

REUPHOLSTERY
0

1 (la My Mama)
| U H  h y  or Might >74-3457 Fr—  IsHwafas j

QUALITY SEED 
PRODUCTS 

AND
SERVICE

ed at a covered dish supper 
Am arillo  last Tuesdayin

even ing for the Retired 
Senior Volunteer Program, it
was the Board o f

Wayne Hardin, son o f Mr. and Mrs. Homer Hardin, gave the salutatory address Friday night at 
high school commencement exercises held in the Harned Sisters Fine Arts Building o f 
Clarendon College. An overflow crowd o f parents, relatives and interested spectators were on 
hand for the 1975 graduation.

Quality Service and Supply
208 N. Taylor Amarillo, Texas 79105 Phone 1-373-7731

Am ong Dr. C a ldw ell’ s 
other honors and awards 
have been in itiation into 
Alpha Omega Alpha, Na­
tional Honor Medical Fra­
ternity, o f which he was 
president his senior year; the 
State o f  Texas M erit 
Scholarship for all four years 
o f medical school; a gold 
Omega watch from La Roche 
Pharmaceutical Company in 
the spring o f his sophomore 
year for highest scholastic 
standing, and S500 from 
Southland L ife  Insurance 
Company the spring o f this 
year for highest scholastic 
standing. He will begin a 
year's internship July 1 at

i f i , p
m

IP” ILk/tI'm proud
to hovo tho opportunity to 

sorvt farmers in this area with quality, 
high yielding DEKALB seed. I stand 
ready to serve you. ' j

Phillip Randy Wiggins, left, son o f Mr. and Mrs. W . B. 
Wiggins o f Hedley was named the valedictorian o f the Hedley 
High School Seniors Class this year with a 93.67 grade 
average. Shauna White Monroe, right, daughter o f Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold White, was salutatorian o f the class, earning a 
91.99 grade average. The announcement was made by 
Glyndol Holland, school principal.

DEPEND ON DEKALBy l
*0

'DEKALB" il • r.gl.t.rM) bund nimr "XL" numb.il »'• hybrid d .n » . » « l ,

Frank Whita Jr. 974-2449

Rapco-Foam ....the new 
insulation in town. Rapco- 
Roam is a highly efficient, 
non-flammable insulating 
material. But unlike conven­
tional fiber insulation that 
leaves un-insulated gaps, 
this insulation is pumped 
into spaces as a liquid foam 
that looks much like shaving 
cream. In a short time it 
becomes firm, assuming the 
shape of the walls around it, 
and is h ighly e ffec tive  
thermal barrier that can save 
hundreds o f dollars in 
heating and cooling costs. 
Quality Service and Supply of 
Amarillo are the Homefoam- 
ers for the Texas Panhandle. 
They’ ll come to your house, 
make some small holes in the 
outside walls and pump in 
Rapco-Foam right on top of 
any existing insulation, and 
they can add to your ceiling 
insulation, too. The holes are

plugged and painted or 
stained so that they're hardly 
noticeable. In most cases the 
job can be done in a single 
day. The savings from fuel 
bills can be as much as 30 
percent.

Quality service and supply 
also has spray on insulation 
for bams and work sheds in 
their monotherm line and 
spray on roofing to solve your 
insulation problems there as 
well as leaking roofs.

Quality Service and Supply 
is also proud o f there 
seamless floor line. Its the 
new way to go for a tough, 
durable floor that has no 
seams. Its a floor that is 
tougher than regular vinyl 
and needs no waxing, ever. 
It’ ll handle the dirty farm 
boots with no problem and its 
shine lasts almost for ever. 
The seamless flooring is 
being used in many

commercial building in the 
Texas Panhandle because it 
is so durable. House wives 
w ill love it and so will 
farmers because it’ s so easy 
to clean the woman of the 
house will have more time 
out in the fields, 
than regular vinyl and needs 
no waxing, ever. It’ ll handle 
the dirty farm boots with no 
problem and its shine lasts 
almost for ever. The 
seamless flooring is being 
used in many commercial 
building in the Texas 
Panhandle because it is so 
durable. House wives will 
love it and so will farmers 
because it’ s so easy to clean 
the woman o f the house will 
have more time out in the 
fields.

Quality Service and Supply 
also has fireproofing material 
and sound deading mater- 
al....ad all purpose coatings.

TK  WELDERS
Of Northwest Texes 

Don Turner — Don’s Welding
Residence - 1625 S. Baylor 

Perryton, Texas 806 - 435-5246

Portable Oilfield & Feedlot Welding 
Farm  - Ranch & Shop W elding 

Fabrication & Repair W ork 

Steel, Building ConstruA*on 
W e Design & Build Almost Anything-

$300,000.00 Liability Insu-

- Clarendon Shop -
Highway 287 East - 

South o f Chamberlain Motors

Roddy Klinnert - Shop Foreman
Box 966 Clarendon, Texas 79226 806 874-2642

W indm ill & Submersible Pump Repair 

Trenching St L ight Winch Service 

South o f 1-40 Only

Need insurance? 
Shop and Save 

at Th e  Insurance Store.

G E N E R A L  R E V E N U E  S H A R I N G  P L A N N E D  U S E R E P O R T
• i  c<an is publishedGeneral Revenue Sharing provides federal funde directly to local and state governments. This report of your gove> '- -  

to encourage citizen participation in determining your government s decision on how the money will be spent * . Any complaints of 
discrimination in the uee of these funds may be sent to 
the Office of Revenue Sharing. Wash.. D .C. 20226.

PLANNED EXPENDITURES

(A ) C A TE G O R IE S (B ) C A P ITA L  ,C: » O P E R A TIN G  / 
M A IN TE N A N C E

1 PUBLIC SAFETY $ s
2 ENVIRONMENTAL 

PROTECTION $  $

3 PUBLIC
TRANSPORTATION $ . S

4 HEALTH $  s
S P{CREATION s $
B LIBRARIES

$  $

T SOCIAL SERVICES 
FOR AGED OR POOR $  s

S FINANCIAL
ADMINISTRATION $

• MULTIPURPOSE AND 
GENERAL GOVT

10 EDUCATION

11 SOCIAL 
DEVELOPMENT

12 HOUSING A COM­
MUNITY DEVELOPMENT

13 ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT •

14 OTHER lipeeify)

3  5 0 , 2 8 1 _________ 1

s
$

$

$

$

IE  t o t a l s S 5 0 , 3 8 1  $

THE GOVERNMENT 
OF DONLEY COUNT

Need sporting goods? You go to a sporting goods 
store.

Need jewelry? You go to a jewelry store.
But when you need insurance—where do you go?
Now you can do all your insurance shopping the new 

easy w a y -a t The Insurance Store.
Here, at The Insurance Store, you can buy all your 

homeowners, auto, marine, health, life, theft, liability, 
bond, aviation, and business insurance.

You can choose from a wide variety of leading b ra n d s- 
includingContinental Insurance.

Our rates are com petitive.
And our trained sales staff can help you save even 

more by showi ng you how to buy what you need—without 
buying what you don’t need.

Best of a lI, we service what we sel I.
Need insurance? Shop and save the new easy way—at 

The Insurance Store.
ANTICIPATING A GENERAL REVENUE 

SHARING PAYMENT OF

FOR THE SIXTH ENTITLEMENT PERIOD JU LY  * ' i -tO d G H  JUNE i
1976 PLANS TO SPEND THESE FUNDS FOR THE PURPOSES SHOWN

ACCOUNT NO.

DONLEY COUNTY 
COUNTY JUDGE 
PD BOX 7 7 7  
CLhRENDEN TEXAS

•H i ' 0 6 5  065
»4

Thi
The M

Agricultural

W ANT TO LEASE 
GRASSLAND 
JemeeHefley 

779-3134 
Box 42

McLean, Texas 79057
3-9-tfc

For Sale

FOR SALE MfCC Toy poodles 
874-2420. Anytime.

14-tfc

Per sale Lankard cotton seeJ 
#3840 and 57. Call Luthur 
Butler 874-2127.

18-2tp

For Sale: Poodle puppies. 
874-2392.

17-tfc

F en c in g ..4,5,6 foot chain 
link. M aterials only, or 
installed. Call or write for 
estimates. 806-259-2742, 
P .O . Box 67, Memphis, 
Texas 79245, 102 Boykin 
Drive.

16-tfc

For Solo. Sweet potato 
plants. 874-3752.

19-2tc

For Solo Doablo oven
electric stove $275.00, Dish­
washer $195.00. 720 Leroy 
St. 874-2489.

19-tfc

For Sale AKC Irish Sitters, 
6 weeks old. Call for 
information 874-3729.

19-2tc

I am going to disperse my 
Angus and mixed cow herd. 
Will sell all are part, with or 
without Charolais calves. Jim 
Butler 874-3732.

19-2tc

Real Estate

For Solo-3 bedroom house 
with double garage and 
cellar. Call after 5:00 p.m. 
and on weekends, 874-3472

18-2tc

9 Unit Motel with living 
quarters in Clarendon, would 
trade for dwelling as pert 
payment in Wichita Fells or 
Qusnsh. Coffee Ins. A  Real 
Estate Agency, Inc. 
817-551-9951

16-7tc

FOR SALE: NEW 3 bedroom 
brick house. Double garage, 
central heat, refrigerated air, 
carpeted thru out, }  fall 
Baths, built-in kitchen. 150 
Ft. frontage lot. Financing 
availaEle. Ed or M ary 
Sawyer 806-874-3664:

23-tfc

79226

iUiiullil:<ILuiUiUillilililuililiiuliillillitillliiU 

ID) Submit proposal! for funding consideration by- Juno 15,197,5.

T  0. SIMMONS
'J

» Cgvfflt z_Judgo
supporting documents, srt opsn for public scrutiny

A copy of this rsport. «~ t

The office of the County Judge, Clarondon, Texai
IE) ASSURANCES (Rsfer to instruction E* I eisure ths Secretary of tho Trsj'.ry 
that ths non-discriminetion end other statutory requirements listed in Port E of 
tho instructions accompanying this report mill bo complied with by this recip snt 
government with roapocj; to ths entitlement funds reported hereon

nature of Chief Enecutive Officer

F ir0 -  C a su a lty  -  A u to  -  Life

T E L E P H O N E  874-3506
C L A R E N D O N .  T E X A S

Jud 8° -

J V

HOUSE FOR SALE: 620 S 
McLain. 3V4 lota, storm* 
cellar, 2 bedroom. Contact 
Robert Pertain. Rt. 1. 
Clarendon.

8-tfc

Rentals

•  Warehouse &  Private office
space for rent. i
May 1st. Approxim ately 
1,700 sq. ft. Open area al 
utilities furnished, central ah
and heat. Large 
door excess. 874-3541.

FOR RENT: nice clea 
modern duplex apartment 
Contact Jack Clifford.

19-tf<
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IfM a i 1e e l Place
-P h o n e  874-3541

Chamberlain
by M IS . HAWLEY HARRISON

The Market Place

J Agricultural
I

W ANT TO LEASE 
G1ASSLAND 

\  Je -esIM M y  
779-3134 
Bex 42

I I McLean, Texas 79997
l O i f .  J*7*UC

For Sale

FOR SALE a KC Toy poodles 
874-2420. Anytime.

14-tfc

Far sale Lankard cotton seed 
#3840 and 57. Call Luthur 
Butler 874-2127.

18-2tp

Far Salei Poodle puppies. 
874-2392.

'J

* \

For Sale AKC Irish Sitters, 
6 weeks old. Call for 
information 874-3729.

19-2tc

1 am going to disperse my 
Angus and mixed cow herd. 
Will sell all are oart. with or 
without Charolais calves. Jim 
Butler 874-3732.

19-2tc

0

‘J

Real Estate

For Sale-3 bedroom house 
with double garage and 
cellar. Call after 5:00 p.m. 
and on weekends, 874-3472

18-2tc

9 Unit Metal with living 
quarters in Clarendon, would 
trade for dwelling as part 
payment in Wichita Falls or 
Quanah. Coffee Ins. & Real 
Estate Agency, Inc. 
817-551-9951

16-7tc

’J

Rentals

24-tf

FOR BENTi nice dean  
modern duplex apartment. 
Contact Jack Cliffoiti.

19-tfc

: to reject any ad If I

Far rent! 3 room unfurnished 
apartment. 874-2281.

16-tfc

REPAIR SERVICE 
171015th A .  

Wellington. Texas 79095

TV Sets For Rent. Inquire at 
Henson’s.

____________ 3-tfc

FOR RENT: Modern two bed 
room duplex apartment. Call 
Bob Bell 874-3915 or 
874-2576.

25-tfc

BEFORE YOU arrange 
I  finance your new or late ' 
f  model car, compare my new a 
1 Iqw cost finance rates. I can I  
I  save you money.

Emmett O. Simmons 8

L at the Farmers State Bank 9 
M  m  n ^   ̂^ - t f c ?

RHODE PIPE CO.
Bex 747 

,Tx 79237 
i [844] 823-2458

A l l

Far Rent 2
furnished house. 
2420.

bedroom 
Call 874-

18-tfc

Far read 2 bedroom house. 
Oneta Sanders, 874-2533

3-tfc

feN N uuuew u**# «% <»au£^i
Contact

FOR SALE
2 A  3 Bedroom Houses 

Listings Wanted 
Sanders Real Estate 

820 S. Allen 
874-2533

TU NE U W -^U FFLE R  
Or

MAJOR OVERHAUL 
On-The-Fann Service 

STEVE’S AUTOMOTIVE 
R INDUSTRIAL 

323 S. Kearney 874-3446 
Clarendon, Texas

Oar bnslneos Is complete, 
efficient car service. We  
dean the glass...sweep out 
the car...check the radiator 
and hoses...the fan belt 
and tires. We keep yen 
Informed about the comU- 
don of

CORNELL TEXACO 
SERVICE STATION 

303 W . 2nd. 874-3441

Shop with One Stop far every need.

Came In and browse. New merrhandlar arriving dally

201 S. Kearney ..Phono 874-2043.. .Clare ad on, Tex. 
Mr. and Mrs. G. W . Eadack, Owners k  Operators

$30 to $&u more 
per calf with 
Charolais bulls

Bred and reused for this area- 
Ready to yse Come by soon

174-37911

17-tfc

Fencing...4,5,6 foot chain 
link. Materials only, or 
installed. Call or write for 
estimates. 806-259-2742, 
P.O. Box 67, Memphis, 
Texas 79245, 102 Boykin 
Drive.

16-tfc

For Sale. Sweet potato 
plants. 874-3752.

19-2tc

For Sale Doable oven
electric stove $275.00, Dish­
washer $195.00. 720 Leroy 
St. 874-2489.

19-tfc

18-3tc

Rant or Lease Farm 110
Acres, 33.6 acres pasture, 
Windmill tank, 4 room 
house, cattle sheds. In Lelia 
Lake, Texas. 1975 lease. 
Hermon W . Lester, 616 
North Second Street, Tem­
ple. Texas 76501.

18-3tc

Anglin

For Bonded 
Termite & Roach 

Control 
by Qualified FlrmS 

Phone 874-2438 S

* * * * * * * * * * * * * *
EXTERIOR and INTERIOR
Pain dag • Free Estimates 874-3570

Reasonable Rates
Call 259-2813 Memphis

B. G. HILL
* * * * * * * * * *  * * * *

Rattan's TV Sarvlce A  Salas
Your Zenith Dealer

DENNIS RATTAN TEX NAYLOR

Main Street

Mr. and Mrs. Taylor Allen 
and Kevin of Goree, visited 
his brother Mr. and Mrs. 
Mark Allen this weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Dingier and Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Mann visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Jiggs Mann, Mark and 
Camille Friday night after 
Commencement Exercised. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gilbert Mann 
of Amarillo were with them, 
too.

Clay Eugene Harrison of 
Heyburn, Idaho received his
degree in Animal Science 
and harming from University 
of Idaho last week.

Mr. and Mrs. James 
Morgan and Jason of 
Amarillo visited Mr. and 
Mrs. D.R. Koontz Friday.

Gloria and Brenda Wash­
ington of Amarillo, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Barbee visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Barbee 
and attended Commence­
ment Exercises Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Wilie 
and Mr. and Mrs. Otto Wilie 
of California, Mr. Jess Ivey. 
Mr. and Mrs. Morris Crump 
were dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Travis Ivey and Mr. 
Alford Ivey Thursday.

Hudgins Quilting Club met 
Tuesday with Mrs. Grace 
Ayres. Everyone had a 
wonderful time.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bogard 
of Bula and Tommy Ann 
Gaston of Ft. Worth visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Blackman 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy

Blackman attended funeral 
services for Mrs. George 
Bulman Sunday afternoon.

Sandra Longan and Mitze 
visited Thursday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Hardin.

Mr. Alford Ivey and Mr. 
and Mrs. Travis Ivey were 
dinner guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
Morris Crump Sunday.

Mr. O.D. Koontz visited 
Mr. and Mrs. D.R. Koontz 
Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Cowan 
and girls of Tulia visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard Dingier 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Cannon and Lisa of Navasota 
came Sunday to attend 
funeral services for his aunt 
Mrs. George Bullman. We 
wish to extend our sympathy 
to the loved ones and friends.

Mrs. Clara Mae Carter 
visited with Ruth and Nell 
Corbin Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. Nelda Jones of 
Dalhart was elected presi­
dent of Xi * Delta Gamma 
Chapter of Beta Sigma Phi 
Sorority recently.

Mrs. Grady Parsons of 
Hereford and Mrs. Richard 
Cannon visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Cannon and Lisa, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dennie 
Harrison and Anna at Mr. 
and Mrs. Hawley Harrisons 
Sunday evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
Ballew visited Sunday after­
noon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Dingier.

Miscellaneous. T V  Cable Service

WIH buy, haul, or stack 
your alfalfa. CaU 383-2376 or 
374-7657 in Amarillo or write 
Box 22, Lelia Lake, Tex. 
79240.

19-4tp

THREE 
CLEAR CHANNELS 
Plus FM  Music and 

Continuous W sathsr 8c 
On Channol •

For Information and 
Surrlcu Call 874-3570 

OF CLARENDON
CABLE T V

OF CLARENDON

C O N N IE’S 
R A D IO  A  TV  

REPAIR
. Phone 874-3752

r * * * * * * * * * * * *  
HAJ OIL COMPANY 

Harvie DBA June 
Truck Stop 

Super Service 
Car Wash

k Home 874-3589 874-9980
*  * r *  * ★ ★ * ★ ★ ★ * * <

T tr The Clarendon Pr ss 
WANT ADS 

’ bey’ll Wort For Y# . 
874-3641

>W S N O W I N G
For Sale

Make PLANS Now
For Those Necessary Repair and Remodeling Jobs 

With MATERIALS From 
Foxworth-Galbraith Lumber Co.

LLoyd McCord, Mgr.
301 E. 2nd. 874-3334 Cfarondun, Texas

Phone 874-3541 

To  Place Y o ur W ant A d  1

AVON REPRESENTATIVES

NEEDED FOR Clarendon, Memphis, Childress and 
Wellington.

CaU this # 806-669-9792 and leave your name and phone 
number, and you wlU be contacted immediately.

COUNTY MANAGER

Wonderful Opportunity if you cun qualify. Must be able to 
speak on feet, honest, a leader, organizer, desire to help 
people as weU as earn a considerable amount of money. We 
have our own plant, and the finest Organic Fertilizer and 
Animal Mineral Supplement available today. W e want a man 
to seU, hire and train men In his County and teach this 
concept to every farmer in his County how to farm without 
chemicals or poisons. If the nature of this idea appeals to your 
Nature, wire us telling of your background and desires. Dr. 
Jim Jones, President, The Bon Vita Company. 141 East Third 
Street, Hereford, Texas 79045. Phone 364-5441.

M
A

Y

EXTRA LONG 108-inch 
traditional sofa and chair for 
sale. Excellent condition. See 
at Osburn Furniture.

19-tfc

■ Small gray and beige 
Siamese cat with no collar. 
Reward. Rev. P.V. Hamilton 
874-2322.

19-ltp

First Anniversary sale 6 
big days, June 2 thru 7. 
Selected merchandise 20 
percent to SO per cent off. 
Door prizes. Drawing June 
7th, Craft Corner, Groom, 
Tezas.

19-ltc

“ CONFIDENTIAL Care for 
pregnant unwed mothers. 
EDNA GLADENY HOME, 
2308 Hemphill, Fort Worth, 
Texas. Toll free number 
1-800-792-1104.”

4-tfcs

RAY APPLIANCE SERVICE

General Electric Franchise Dealer 
Heating and Air Conditioning 

W e service all makes of A ir Conditioning 
Freezer and Refrigeration 

Service & Repairs 
D.P. R AY, owner 

Clarendon, Texas 874-3801

BUY YOUBINSUR ANCI
FROM A

LOCAL INDEPENDENT AGENT 
OUR INTEREST IS YOU 

SERVICE TO YOU IS FIRST 
FIRE CASUALTY AUTO LIFE 

HOME LOANS

S )
J ”•s EMMETT SIMMONS » 4 .3stt

FOR SALE: NEW 3 bedroom 
brick house. Double garage, 
centra] heat, refrigerated sir, 
carpeted thru out, J. fall 
Baths, built-in kitchen. 150 
Ft. frontage lot. Financing 
available. Ed or Mary 
Sawyer 806-874-3664:

____________ 23-tfc

HOUSE FOR SALEt 620 S. 
McLain. 3Vi lota, storm' 
cellar, 2 bedroom. Contact 
Robert Partain, Rt. 1,_ 
Clarendon.

8-tfc

Job Wanted in farm work, 
construction, driving heavy 
equipment, or yard work. 
Call Cleveland Turner at 
874-3935.

____________________ 19-ltc

Help Wanted-Need wo­
man for maid work. Morning 
hours Apply in person at 
Western Skies Motel.

18-tfc

Wanted! RN and LVN 
Apply to Adminstrator 1200 
7th Street N.W . Childress, 
Tezas 817/937-8668.

A u to m o b ile
T ip s

r

OIL PUMP'
FORCES OIL THROUGH THE 
FILTER to lu b r ic a te  ALL 
v ita l  PARTS OF THE ENGINE 
DEFECTS ARE SIGNALLED 
0V LOW OIL PRESSURE 
ENGINE KNOCKS AND 
A NOT ENGINE CAN 
CADGE EXCESSIVE 
HEAR OF MOVING (ARTS 
OR. COMPLETE STOPPAGE 
WEn p efe c p v e , WE PUMP 
\S USUALLY REPLACED AS A UNIT.

18-6tc

•Warehouse St Private ofllee 
space for rent. Available 
May iat. Approximately
1,700 aq. ft. Open area all 
utilities furnished, central air 
and heat. Large eve 
door excess. 874-3541.

RN and LVN needed Good 
salary and benefits. Contact 
Concho County Hospital and 
nursing home. Box L, Eden, 
Texas 76837. 915-869-5911.

17-3tc

W ill build cellars in 
Clarendon. Call Loyd Ford.

Eddie Floyd Shop
1st* Sully______________  874-3776

^BAILEY ESTES ANDSON
K  faftau»S jamAEmaobr a D r i c a i m g

The Clarendon Press
Will be

CLOSED FRIDAY
Since it was impossible for our 
employees to observe Mon­
day, May 26, as a holiday. The

Clarendon Press will close 
Friday, May 30th. We will not 
be open for business until 
Monday', June 2.
Please conduct any business 
prior to 5 p.m. May 29th.

2
9

7
5

I t

W

:AM 66 SERVICE 

874-2155

OH, Thus,
fas A 874-2003

CLARENDON PRESS
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Ashtola-Martin
by MRS. HUBERT RHOADES

<r Mr. and Mrs Pete Land 
came home Tuesday they 
visited her sister Mrs. Edd 
McDaniel in Ft. Worth and in 
Mineola they visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Massie.

M ary Thornberry and 
M elba  R isley attended a 
sewing seminar at Sakowitz 
in Amarillo on Tuesday.

< Mr. and Mrs. Jack Land 
moved her mother Emma 
M cCalester from Cousin’ s 
home in Memphis back to 
h er home in Ardm ore, 
Oklahoma. Mrs. Jack Land is 
with her mother at this time.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Shadle 
visited her niece Mr. and 
M rs. J.B . W alker in 
hainview Tuesday.
'  Alta Shaller visited Tues­
day with Gay Cole. 
t  Mr. and Mrs. Othel Elliott 
have just returned from a 
visit with their son Reverand 
and Mrs. Harold Elliott in 
Arlinton and in Jacksonville 
they vis ited  with other 
relatives.

Adenia Mills o f Lelia Lake 
spent the weekend with her 
grand parents Mr. and Mrs. 
L .A . Watson.

Sussie Floyd, Dartha 
Reynolds, Billy Hicks and 
Roselie Watson visited and 
brought the folks at Medical 
Center a devotional in music, 
song and prayer on Tuesday 
morning.

Mr. L.O. Christie is not as 
well as usuall at this time.

M elinda Lyles o f Ste- 
phensville is spending a few 
days with her parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Eldon Lyles and 
others.

Mrs. Ruth Perkins and Mrs. 
A.J. Parker visited Thursday 
with Mrs. Melba Risley.

Guy Sibley was released 
from the hospital Thursday 
he is doing fine.

Mr. and Mrs. Wallace Cos 
and son o f Tulsa, Oklahoma 
and Mrs. Marie McCracken 
o f McLean visited Sunday 
afternoon with Etta R ey­
nolds.

BUI Reynolds left Friday 
morning to visit his son in 
j ir ahatn before returning

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Risley 
had as their house guest 
Friday night Lloyd’s cousin 
Jack Ross o f Los Angeles, 
California.

Our sympathy to the 
family o f Lelia Bulman who 
died Friday evening at Hall 
County Hospital.

Eldon Lyles who is 
working at Childress came 
home Friday night for the 
weekend.

M r. and M rs. C lifford  
James o f  M cLean visited 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Koontz.

Jana’ s grand mother Jones 
Sara, Oklahoma and her 

rother M r. and Mrs. 
Norman Jones of Dallas were 

lest in the Jeny Koontz

r,
guest
home.

grand mot 
Clarendon.

mother Margaret in

Mr. and Mrs. Jiggs Mann 
and children entertained 
these relatives and guest 
with a supper at their home 
Friday night after gradua­
tion: Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
W. Wood o f Lubbock, Mr. 
and Mrs. Perry Wood, Mr. 
and Mrs. GUbert Mann, Mr. 
and Mrs. WUlie Roberts, 
Mrs. Gene Davis o f AmarUlo, 
Mrs. J.D. Wood and Mr. and 
M rs. Henry Mann, M rs. 
Richard Dingier, Chris Craft 
o f Oarendon, Gary Aven o f 
Sequin.

The youngsters later 
attended the Senior party.

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Lyles 
and Melinda spent Sunday in 
Turday with M rs. J .A . 
Fuston.

Mr. and Mrs. BUI Bennett 
and her brother Bud Butler 
o f Lelia Lake returned from 
their vacation trip in Mexico 
Monday. They w ere in 
Albuquerque with Betsy 
Butler Thursday night and 
then in Bloomfield with Mr. 
and Mrs. J.D. Wooten who 
took them to points o f 
interest.

Doyce and Mike Graham 
stopped by the Hubert 
Rhoades Wednesday.

Lois Scroggins visited in 
Claude W ednesdav a fter.

noon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd Reid and stopped by 
the Hubert Rhoades. Ethel 
Reid continues to inprove.

Lena Mae Graham visited 
Thursday afternoon with 
Mrs. Nuford DU1.

Mrs. Nuford Dill received 
word her cousin Clara White 
o f Sunset had a heart attack 
and is a patient in the 
hospital at Decatur.

Dan Hall accompines Mrs. 
Clarence Hall to Childress 
Friday night where they 
attended graduation exercis­
es at which Rickey Mills 
received his diploma.

Mrs. Harold Green and 
Cheryl o f Phillips were in 
Canyon on business W ed­
nesday enroute home they 
stopped at Medical Center 
for a visit with Mrs. Austin 
Rhoades.

Jason Green had lunch 
with the Horace Greens on 
Wednesday.

Lois Scroggins of Okla- 
homa visited a few days with 
Mr. and Mrs. Homer Estlack 
and visited others.

Ted Shaller attended a 
work shop in Canyon 
Wednesday and stopped at 
the Hubert Rhoades on 
business.

Mrs. John Just of Lelia 
Lake visited Thursday with 
Mrs. R.A. Nelson.

Rhonda and Jason Green 
visited Wednesday in Pan­
handle with her parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Gordon Chamber- 
lain. Lori stayed with grand 
mother Green.

M r. and M rs. Tommy 
Porter of Ft. Sill, Oklahoma 
spent Friday night with Mr. 
and Mrs. B.H. Clay.

Mr. and Mrs. Doss Finley 
played 42 with Mr. and Mrs. 
Clovis Bible.

M r. and M rs. E .V . 
Watterson o f Lubbock spent 
the weekend with his aunt 
M rs. O llie Nelson and 
others.

Ann Green and children o f 
Am arillo  v isited  Monday 
with the Horace Greens.

Larry H all o f Am arillo  
visited Thursday evening 
with his grandmother Mrs. 
Ollie Nelson and others.

Mrs. Harvie Lockwood o f 
Amarillo spent Tuesday with 
the Skeet Browns.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Green 
attended graduation exercis­
es in Hedley Thursday night. 
Mary’ s sister Peggy Talley 
received her 8th grade 
diploma.

Larry Gray o f Dimmitt 
spent the weekend with his- 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Vance 
Gray.

M rs. B .H . Clay and 
daughter Mary spent Satur­
day in Spur with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Fichum.

Billy Jack Green and son 
Rodney o f Umbarger visited 
Saturday afternoon with the 
Horace Green family.

Douglas Talley of Hedley
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was a house guest in the 
Jerry Green home for the 
weekend.
Mr. and Mrs. R.R. Partain 

received word Saturday his 
aunt Mrs. Pauline Walker of 
Amarillo had died at her 
home after a lengthy illness.

Mr. and Mrs. R.R. Partain 
were in Am arillo  Sunday 
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Payne 
and Charlotte and Billy Jack 
and Ronnie Green had 
supper Saturday night with 
the Horace Greens.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Finck 
and Eddie o f Salida, 
Colorado are visiting in the 
Skeet Brown home they came 
for Garrys graduation.

Mr. and Mrs. Doss Finley 
visited Saturday evening at 
Hall County Hospital with 
John White who is slowly - 
improving.

M r. and M rs. Harvey 
Lockwood o f Amarfllo visited 
at the Skeet Browns Friday 
evening and attended the 
graduation evercises.

Our sympathy to the

family o f Leia Bulman who 
died Friday night at Hall 
County Hospital after a short 
illness.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Roehr 
spent Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Chet Roehr and Mr. 
and Mrs. J.B.-Lane.

Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Bible 
spent Sunday in Skellytown 
with her brother Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Bolin.

Mr. and Mrs. Doss Finley 
spent Sunday in Amarillo 
with M r. and M rs. Leo 
Hamel.

Nadine Murphey o f Ama­
rillo and Melvin Corner o f 
Kansas City, Missouri spent 
Sunday with her mother Mr. 
and Mrs. James Tolbert.

M r. and M rs. Everett 
Watterson o f Lubbock visited 
Sunday evening with Mrs. 
T .A . Nelson.

Mr. and Mrs. Dell Hall 
and son Richard o f Amarillo 
and Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Kidd 
o f Clarendon attended the 
50th wedding aniversary 
party honoring Mr. and Mrs. 
Buster Painter in Groom

Sunday afternoon.
M r. and M rs. H .S . 

M ahaffey attended the 
funeral services for Mrs. Lela 
Bulman Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. B.H. Clay 
and Mary went to the airport 
in Amarillo Sunday morning 
to meet W ayne Clay o f 
Tocatello, Idaho who will be 
at home for the summer.

Mr. and Mrs. Dell Hall 
and Richard o f Am arillo  
visited Sunday evening with 
Mr. and Mrs. James Tolbert

who had surgery on his wrist 
Friday, and with Mr. and 
M rs. Lonnie Parr and 
children.

W eekend guest in the 
Dane Perdue home were 
tbeir children Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Todd and boys James 
and Jeremy o f Tahoka.

Your reporter Ifas just 
received  word that M rs. 
Sallie Varble died at the 
home o f her daughter in 
California o f a heart attact.

Sunday afternoon Mr. and 
Mrs. Leslie Caffee and Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Ferguson 
o f Panhandle visited in the 
Ollie Nelson home.

and Velma Butler. Velma 
Butler went home with them 
for a visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Doss Finley 
visited and played 42 with 
the H.S. Mahaffeys Saturday 
night.

Mrs. Rhonda Green, Jason 
and Lori had lunch with the 
Horace Greens on Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bennett 
were in Amarillo Saturday 
and visited Bill’ s son Jimmy

*

Congratulations to all the 
graduation class o f 1975 but 
a very special congratulation 
goes to Gary Davis as the 
recepiant o f the F ighting 
Heart Award and to those 
who helped him. ft

7.00% Interest On Swings
Take Advantage of thei Modem Annuity.
♦Internet Is tax sheltered until withdrawn.
•Make deposits or withdrawals at any time. 
•Deposits can be withdrawn and the Interest left la 

plan at compound Interest with no income taxes d 
•No lead chargee or service expenses of any kind. 
•QuoMee for Internal Revenue Tax Sheltered Plan* 
•Safety it  deposits is guaranteed.

• MAURICE RISLEY, REPRESENTATIVE
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NIGHTLY 7*30 p.m. -10*00 p.a».
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Those visiting in the Lloyd 
Risley home Friday night 
were Gars Lohoefer and her 
grand daughter Jeannie 
Sharp, M r. and M rs. 
Maurice Risley and Janet and 
Adam Risley and Jack Ross.

Mrs. A . Pittman and Mrs. 
Ray Pittman o f Am arillo  
came for M rs. Bulman’ s 
funeral and had supper with 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Shadle..

Gary Aven of Seguin was a 
house guest for the weekend 
in the Jiggs Mann home and 
attended the graduation 
evercises.

A  special welcome to the 
J iggs Mann fam ily who 
moved to their remodeled 
farm home in the Martin 
Community about the first of 
May.

M r. and M rs. Tommy 
Waldrop and Colby of Friona 
spent the weekend with his 
mother Margaret Waldrop 
and visited others.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Cobb of Tulia had lunch with 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Land 
Sunday.

These o f M rs. L.O . 
Christie’ s family surprised 
her with a birthday dinner 
Sunday at the Christie home.

Melba and Bonita Martin 
Sally and Becky Moore of 
Dalhart, Lee Christie o f 
Idalou, Mr. and Mrs. Shug 
Noble, Tommy, Mark, Gary 
and Meil, Neva' and Melody 
Perdue, Danny and Oma 
Jacobs, Chris Weems all of 
Amarillo, Debbie Noble o f 
Austin, Sidney Harp Lub­
bock, Mrs. Pearl Self and 
Mrs. Florance Harp o f 
Clarendon, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Fawlkes, Mr. and Mrs. 
Melvin Hwlkes John and 
Melissa o f Rorger.

M elba Martin and Lee 
Christie attended Mrs Lela 
Bulman’s funeral services in 
the afternoon.

M r. and M rs. Nelson 
Christie o f Chin lee, New 
Mexico are in the process o f 
moving to Albuquerque, 
New Mexico where he will be 
Forking with the A A A  

Collage as Counse-

Shanna Cole spent Sunday

it iim ii

...a car the entire family can 
enjey for years to come! Pat 
yewrself in the driver's seat ef 
eae ef ear 1975 automobiles!

LARGEST 
LUXURY 
CAR DEALER
IN THIS 
AREA

J

Dozens of N e w  1975 Luxury Cars N ow  

In Stock at our LUXURY SUPERM ARKET!

LARGEST SELECTION YET!
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and
l_ote spem 
Monday

The Hoppyfoee Place
I UleVe In business to moke you smle

ONLY SUPERIOR PRODUCTS 
AND SERVICE SEPARATE US 
FROM OTHER DEALERS...

Low, bank-rate financing available on models... lots of 
low mileage, exceptionally nice pre-owned . 
late models to choose from.

WHY WAIT?...LET US PUT 
YOU IN THE DRIVER’S SEAT!
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Chamberlain Motor Co
with her


