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Valley Slips By Crowell Sesquicentennial 

In Final Seconds of Pla Meeting Held 
 y A meeting of the committee 

The Valle' 	I', • .•,, • 	, , ,ted 
Crowell Friday night of last week 

and took (heir first district win. 
The first half w as scoreless, 

then in the third period. Crowell 
took the lead when Jeff Wright 

scored on an 11 yard run and 
made the extra point. 

Valley rallied with Tim ('lar 
dy's eight-yard run, followed by 
Kirk Saul's pass for two comer 

sion points to Shon Phelps. 
Valley held the one point lead 

until Criss Morrison caught a 

Valley Booster Club 
Met October 15 

The Valley Booster Club met 
October 15 at 7:00 p.m. in the 
Valley School Cafetorium. Those 
present viewed the Crowell Val 
ley football game on video which 
was highlighted by comments by 
Coach Ted Giddens. He expres-
sed the importance of the game 
with Knox City on Friday night. 
October 19, at 7:30 o'clock in 
Knox City. At this time the 
Booster Club would like to 
encourage everyone to support 
the Valley Patriots by attending 
the game Friday night. There 
will he a victory line, so bring 
your cow bells and bandarras. 

There will be a junior varsity 

game with Childress here at 
Valley Thursday, October 18. at 
7:30 p.m The junior high will 
play Thursday. October 18. at 
Floydada against Lubbock Chris-

tian Junior High at 5:30 p.m. 
The Booster Club elected as 

officers for the year Lynn Cox, 
president: Donna Stark. secre-

tary-treasurer, and Ginger Mul-
lin. report er. 

Coach I ,iddens and the Rooster 
Club urge all parents to at tend a 

meetinc Monday night, October 
Ti. at 70) o'clock in the Valley 
Cafetorium. when he will give 
insight to the new law. , nevrn -

Ins; athletics. Support the Pat ri 
ots! 

- submitted hi 

Ginger Mullin. reporter 

Lucas Studio 
To Make 
Children's Pictures 

Winston Lucas. professional 
photographer from Irving. Tex 

as. will he in Turkey Saturday 
morning. October 20, at 9:00 a.m. 

and in Quitaque at 1:00 p.m. to 
take photographs for the child-

ren's photograph contest to he 
published in the Valley Tribune. 

Please bring your children to 
the Valley Tribune office in one 
of the cities. If parents have an 
appointment that conflicts with 
one of the times, you may take 
your child to the other town for 
photos. 

I3-yard pas, :sip. 	 ›atil :11 

the fourth period. 'Dien Morrison 
intercepted a Crowell pass on the 
Valley one yard line in the final 
seconds to preserve the victory. 
Middle linebacker Bob ('lay 
added a standout performance 
defensively. 

The win brings Valley's record 
to 4 I overall and 1-0 in loop play. 

Crowell now stands at 3-3 and 
0l. 

Statistically, Valley had 12 
first downs to Crowell's 14. In 
net yards rushing, the Patriots 
had only 75 as compared with 
140; Valley had 84 yards passing 
to 24 for Crowell; total yards 
gained was close with 159 to 164 
in Crowell's favor. The Patriots 
completed seven pasSes, which 
probably will be their main suit 
this year with a young team, and 
Crowell had only two passes 
completed. 

Coach Ted Giddens said. "A 
great effort resulted in a great 
victory. We are very proud of the 
Crowell win. but we must forget 
it now and prepare for Knox 
City. I'm afraid every district 
game may be as tough as the one 
we saw with Crowell last Friday 
night." 

Criss Morrison received honor-
able mention in the Amarillo 
Daily News "Player of the 
Week." Congratulations. Criss! 
Keep up the good work. 

--o 

Butter and Cheese 
To Be Given Away 

Butter and cheese will be 
given away at the City Hall in 
Quitaque DAYS ONLY Wednes-
day, October 24. and Thursday. 

October 25. 

—o 

Judges Attend 
Seminar In Amarillo 

Ninety-six justices of the peace 
attended a 20-hour Texas Justice 
of the Peace seminar September 
11-14 in Amarillo. 

The training center is based at 
Southwest Texas State Univer-
sity in San Marcos. The seminars 
are held in compliance with 
Article .5972. Section B. of the 
Texas Revised Civil Statutes. 

Among the judges attending 
were Roy Patterson of Turkey. 
Hall County Precinct 4; Roy 
Smith of Matador. Motley Coun-
ty Precinct 1: Ruhy Roden of 
Memphis. Hall County Precinct 

1: Earl R. Cox of Tulia, Swisher 
County Precinct I; W. C. Weath-
erred of Kress. Swisher County 
Precinct 4: James R. Edwards of 
Silverton. Briscoe County Pre-
cinct 1. and Dick Taylor 1)1 .  

Quitaque. Briscoe County Pre-
cinct 2.  

heads and other interested per 

sons was held Thursday night in 
the Bob Wills Cafeteria to make 
more plans for the Sesquicenten 
nial celebration. 

Those present were Sybil and 

Byron Young, Faye Armstrong, 
Nadine Baisden, Keith Green, 
Totsey Bain, Melvin and Guyret 
ta Clinton, Ora Lee King, Marjor 
ie Bell and Marcella Patterson. 

If you have ideas or input, see 
Sybil Young. Any help is greatly 
appreciated. 

NOTICE TO 

TURKEY RESIDENTS 

The Tribune office in Turkey 
will be open only on Monday next 

week. Mrs. Patterson will be out 

of town on Tuesday to attend a 
conference of United Methodist 
Women in Big Spring. 

If you have news or ads on 

Tuesday, please contact Lottie 

Owens at 455-1101 in Quitaque. 
_ 

State Treasurer Ann Richards 
has sent checks totaling $7.3 
million to Texas' 254 counties for 
road construction and mainte 
nance. 

The Treasurer each year dis. 
burses money appropriated by 
the Legislature for the Lateral 
Road Program. The grants may 
be used by counties for the 
purchase of right-of-way and for 
construction and maintenance of 
lateral roads, farm-to-market 
roads or state highways. 

The money is allocated to each 

Absentee Voting 
Began October 17 

It has been announced that 
absentee voting began in the 
county clerk's office Wednesday. 

October 17, and will continue 
through Friday. November 2. 

Office hours are 8:30 a.m. to 
5:00 p.m. each weekday.  

county under a formula based on 

the county's area, rural popula 
tion and lateral road mileage. 
Mrs. Richards said. 

Briscoe County will receive 
$13,729.90. 

IMPORTANT MEETING 

Coach Ted Giddens and the 
Valley Rooster Club 'urge all 
parents to attend a meeting 
Monday night, October 22, at 
7:00 o'clock in the Valley Cafe 
torium. 

Coach Giddens will be giving 
insight to the new laws concern-
ing athletics. Support the Patri-
ots! 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. R. C. 
Green Thursday of last week 
were her sisters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Strickland of Lubbock 
and Mrs. Gordon Montague of 
Plainview. 



THE vALLEi .  TRIBUNE. 

Succe5,,nr to The Quitaque Tribune. Est Wished at Quit moot m 1980 

PUBLISHED EVERY THURSDAY AT QUITAQUE, TEXAS 79255 
BY MRS. 1.0TTIE OWENS 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES PER 1R 

Briscoe, Hall, Motley. Floyd (madam Itaa int I .. 	 $7.50 
Elsewhere 

ADVERTISING RATES upon request. Classificd advertising IR cents per word: minimum 
charge is $1.75 per week for 20 words or less. 

Any erroneous reflection upon the character. standing or reputation of any pet-son. firm or 
corporation which may appear in the columns of The Valley Tribune will he gladly corrected 
upon its bring brought tot he attent ion of t he publisher. The publisher has t he right to accept or 
refuse any article brought to the newspaper for puhlicat ion. Publisher reserves right to cancel 
any advertisement at any Urn, 

POSTMASTER: SEND ADDRESS CHANGES TO 
THE VALLEY TRIBUNE, BOX 478. QttITAQI tE. TEXAS 79255 

   

 

r• 	 OBITUARIES 

 

state 

4 

L
IA

B
IL

IT
IE

S
 

0 

4 

0. 
4 

3 
11.9 

HEWETT ELECTRIC 
455-1324 

For Current Problems 
	 Box 97 

Hewett Can Do—ett 
	

Quitaque, Texas 79255 

KATHY'S BEAUTY SHOP 
Kathy, Elaine and Debbie 

New Schedule Starting October 3 
ELAINE—Wednesday, Thursday, Friday 
KATHY—Thursday, Friday. Saturday 
DEBBIE—Thursday, Friday 

Your Business Appreciated 
Redken Perms, $25.00 to $40.00 

Phone 455-1305 

CARPET SALE 

$1 to $4 off on 
Name Brand Carpet 

PARKER 
FLOOR COVERING 
245 Commerce 
	

Childress, Tx. 

PAGE TWO 0„,„0.0600",'; VALLEY TRIBt 	 THURSDAY, OCTOBER 18, 1984 

Valley Junior High defeated season. 
Childress "B" by the score of 	The Junior Patriots will travel 
14-0. 	 to Floydada Thursday of this 

Van Leal scored on a 55-yard week to play Lubbock Christian. 
run in the first quarter. There Game time is 5:30 p.m. 
was no more scoring until the 
fourth quarter when Lance Ful-
bright ran for a 78-yard touch-
down. Fulbright also ran for the 
two-point conversion. 

On defense, Wade Cagle. 
Shane House. Brandon Stark and 
Warren Merrell had good games. 
Stark also did a good job kicking. 

Valley stands 3-1 for the 

Valley Junior High 
Defeats Childress "B" 

PAULINE DUGGER 

Mrs. Leland (Pauline) Dugger, 
51, died Saturday morning in 
Roswell, New Mexico after a 
short illness. 

Funeral services were held 
there Tuesday at 2:00 p.m. New 
Mexico time at South Manor 
Baptist Church with the Rev. 
Jess Little of Quitaque officia-
ting. 

Mrs. Dugger was a sister of 
Rev. Little. 

	

—o 	 
ROBERT JAMES YATES 

Graveside services for Robert 
James Yates, infant son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Russell Yates. were 
conducted at 2:00 p.m. Tuesday 
in Dreamland Cemetery with the 
Rev. Melvin Clinton. pastor of 
Turkey's First Baptist Church, 
officiating. Arrangements were 
by Schooler-Gordon Funeral Dir-
ectors. 

The infant, who was born in 
Memphis on September 30. died 
Sunday. 

Survivors include his parents. 
Karen and Russell Yates; a 
brother, Cody Russell Yates. of 
the home; grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gerald Carnes of Turkey, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Beck of 
Flomot and Mr. and Mrs. Trent 
Crosby of Lubbock; and great-
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. C. C. 
Yates and Mr. and Mrs. W. G. 
Thrasher, all of Turkey, Mrs. 
Tom Beck of Memphis, Margar. 
ete Crosby of Lubbock, Mildred 
Hulsey and Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Smith. all of Quitaque. 

A memorial fund has been 
established at Peoples State 
Bank in Turkey. 

Therma Farley and her son, 
Steve and family, had visitors 
recently. Therma's son, Bill 
Farley and his wife, Ada, from 
Almagordo, New Mexico travel-
ed to Little Rock, Arkansas to 
pick up their daughter. Yolanda 
Batts, and her two children, 
Amanda and Justin, from North 
Hunts, England, where Yolanda 
and her husband, Michael, are 
stationed with the Air Force. Bill 
and his family stayed a few days 
in the homes of Therma and 
Steve Farley before going on to 
New Mexico. The visit was 
enjoyed very much, it was 
reported. 

	

0 	 

Recent visitors in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Hamilton 
were Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hamilton 
of Lubbock. 

SENAIDA D. CASTRANEDA 

Mrs. Senaida D. Castraneda, 
84, mother of Mrs. Tony Galvan, 
sr. of Turkey, died Tuesday. 
October 9 in a Kingsville hospi-
tal. 

Mass was held Friday at 3:30 
p.m. at St. Martin Catholic 
Church with burial following in 
Chamberlain Cemetery. 

She was preceded in death by 
her husband, Isidro, in 1979. 

A rosary was recited at 7:30 
p.m. at Ramirez-Salinas Funeral 
Home in Kingsville. 

Survivors include two sons, 
Seferino of Phoenix, Arizona and 
Ignacio of Bishop: three daugh-
ters, Rebecca Saldana of Kings-
ville, Barbara Galvan of Turkey 
and Maria Lopez of Bishop; a 
brother, Severo Duarte of Bis-
hop; 17 grandchildren and 27 
great-grandchildren. 

Pallbearers were grandsons, 
Gilbert Saldana of Kingsville, 
David Castaneda of Bishop. Tony 
Galvan, jr., Gilbert Galvan, Ed-
die Galvan and a great-grandson, 
Tony Galvan, Ill. all of Turkey. 

—0— 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe King of 
Dumas visited in the home of her 
sister, Mrs. Glynn Barrett, over 
the weekend. They were on their 
way home from visiting Mr. and 
Mrs. John King at their home on 
Lake Stamford. Saturday night, 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe King, Mrs. 
Glynn Barrett and Judy Barrett 
visited in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Wellman. 

Sunday, October 14, the Kings. 
Mr. and Mrs. Wendell Farley. 
Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Ramsey, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dale Ramsey. Russell 
and Kristin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dwight Ramsey, Bryan, Amy. 
Kayla and Dara, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Wellman, Jamie. Richard 
and Ryan, Mrs. Dennis Farley. 
Melody and Vance and Jana 
Boyles spent the day visiting in 
the home of Mrs. Glynn Barrett, 
Danny and Judy. They all helped 
A. B. Ramsey celebrate his 
birthday. 

—o 

Mr. and Mrs. Lon McKay 
drove to Denver City Sunday to 
visit their daughter and family. 
Mr. and Mrs. W. F. Geissler and 
family. They went to attend the 
wedding of their granddaughter, 
Myra Geissler. The wedding was 
performed Monday night. The 
McKays returned home Tuesday 
afternoon. 

Curtis Family 
Has Reunion 
In Quitaque 

The Curtis family reunion was 
held Sunday at the Community 
Center in Quitaque. 

Those in attendance were Mr. 
and Mrs. N. A. Shackelford, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dan Shackelford, Dana 
and Brandon, Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Davidson, Bonnie and Steven, 
Mrs. Vada Spies, Angie and 
Tracy, Sophie Cook, all of 
Amarillo: Mr. and Mrs. E. R. 
Orcutt, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Farrell, Gus Orcutt, Memphis; 
Mrs. Sal Couch, Estelline; Mr. 
and Mrs. H. R. Curtis, Rev, and 
Mrs. Richard Edwards, Chris 
and Kevin, Olton; Mr. and Mrs. 
H. G. Fogestrone, Carnegie, 
Oklahoma; Mr. and Mrs. Stewart 
McCracken, Tulia; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Stewart and Travis, 
Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Don Davidson, Sterling City; Mr. 
and Mrs. Jon David Davidson, 
Dimmitt; Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Davidson. Rev. and Mrs..Dennis 
Flaugher, Quitaque. 

—o 

Mrs. Reddell Irby visited her 
sister-in-law, Mrs. Waymon Far 
ley, and her niece, Mrs. Ha, 
Perkins, in Paducah Friday 

0 

Mrs. Cora Gragson spent from 
Monday until Wednesday after 
noon in Wellington visiting her 
son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. Willie 
Gragson. On Tuesday evening. 
she attended Eastern Star. The 
chapter there celebrated its 
eightieth anniversary . 

Mr. and Mrs. Ordis Chandler 
and daughter-in-law, Mona Chan-
dler, of Dallas spent last week at 
the Chandler home in Quitaque. 
They visited the Leon McCrack-
ens while here, and all of them 
went to Caprock Canyons State 
Park one evening for supper . 

DID YOU KNOW? 
After a justice ofthe peace has 

served 15 years or more in office, 
he can legally perform wedding 
ceremonies in any county of the 
state for the rest of his life. 

—submitted by Curtis Tunnel! 

Mr. and Mrs. Murry Wayne 
Morrison of Lubbock spent the 
weekend in Quitaque with the 
Murry Morrisons. Mrs. Verlon 
Hamilton flew from her home in 
Roanoke to Lubbock and came to 
Quitaque with the Murry Wayne 
Morrisons. She came to attend 
the wedding of her cousin, 
Clinton Ware, and Dana Garvin 
in Silverton Saturday night. 

P 
0 

.0.11.)sly-aulays 
Personalized Designs—Scenes—Art Carvings 

Save Funeral Home Commission 
SEE US BEFORE YOU BUY 

400 Joliet Plainview, Texas 79072 296.2953 

JUST ARRIVED 
AT RICE'S! 
Moon Boots 

Ladies, Men's, Girl's, Boy's 
All Sizes 

Prices range from $18.00 to $22.00 
Come in while we still have 

your size! 
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REPORT OF CONDITION 
Consolidating domestic and foreign subsidiaries of the 

First National Bank 

AI.I.E1 TRIBUNE 	 PAGE THREE 

of 	
Quitaque 

4.,-. ,y B.r. 	 C" 

In the state of 	Texas 	 September 30 at the close of business on 	  1984 
published in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under title 12. United States Code. Section 161 

Charter Number 	11706 	Comptroller of the Currency 	 11th• 	District 

Statement of Resources and Liabilities 

Cash and balances due from depository institutions 
Noninterest-bearing balances and currency and coin 

Interest-beanng balances 	  
Securities 	  
Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell in domestic offices 
of the bank and of its Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and in IBFs  

Loans and lease financing receivables: 
Loans and leases, net of unearned income. 	 
LESS Allowance for loan and lease losses 	 

LESS Allocated transfer risk reserve   

Loans and leases, net of unearned income, 
allowance, and reserve 

Assets held in trading accounts 	  
Premises and fixed assets (including capitalized leases) 

Other real estate owned  
Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies 
Customers' liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding 	 

Intangible assets 	  
Other assets 	  
Total assets 	  

Deposits. 

In domestic offices 	 19,287 1 

Interest-bearing 	 15,907  

In 

	Noninterest-bearing 	  

In foreign offices, Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and IBFs 

Noninterest-bearing 

Interest-bearing 	 
Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase in domestic 
offices of the bank and of its Edge and Agreement subsidiaries, and in IBFs 	  
Demand notes issued to the U.S. Treasury 	  

Other borrowed money 	  
Mortgage indebtedness and obligations under capitalized leases 	  

Bank's liability on acceptances executed and outstanding 	  

Notes and debentures subordinated to deposits 	  

Other liabilities 
Total liabilities 
Limited-life preferred stock 	  

Perpetual preferred stock 	  

Common stock 	  

Surplus 	  
Undivided profits and capital reserves 	  
Cumulative foreign currency translation adjustments 	  
Total equity capital 
Total liabilities, limited-life preferred stock, and equity capital 	  

2.100 

13, 160 
191 

None 

Nnna 

None 

Nnne 

Nrrnp 

tinno 

12.969  

90 
23,076 

	 !None  

	 IPM=M 

We, the undersigned directors, attest to the correctness of 	 I 	Deloy Myers  
this statement of resources and liabilities. We declare that it 	 Name 

has been examined by us. and to the best of our knowledge 	 Cashier  and belief has been prepared in conformance with the 	 Tale 
instructions and is true and correct 

.1;X aMf  

56-f  

  

of the above-named bank do hereby declare that this Report 
of Condition is true and correct to the best of my knowledge 
and belief 

Directors 

  

  

  

   

   

   

)29t,,J  

October 16, 198 
oeie 
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Brown-McMurtry Implement 
SALES AND SERVICE 

PHONE 806.823-2441 
BOX 77" 

SILVERTON. TEXAS 79257 

Don Brown Clarence Ward 
Home Ph. 823-2292 	Home Ph. 823-2083 

KOKH-TV 25 
Oklahoma's Greatest Movie Station 

Channel 60 

Date Day Time 	Feature 

18, Thurs., 7:00--Bermuda Triangle 	 Brad Crandall, narrator 
19, Fri., 7:00-Legend of Sleepy Hollow 	Jeff Goldblum 
20, Sat., 7:00--A Thunder of Drums Richard Boone. George Hamilton 
22, Mon., 7:00-First You Cry 	Mary Tyler Moore, Anthony Perkins 
22. Mon., 9:00--Breaking Point Bo Svenson, Robert Culp 
23, Tues., 7:00--The Critical List, Part 2 	Ken Howard 
23, Tues., 9:00 -Klute 	 Donald Sutherland 
24, Wed., 7:00--Hotel Paradisio 	 Gina Lollobrigida 

25, Thurs., 7:00 --Seven Women 	 Sue Lyon 

26, Fri., 7:00--The Man Who Would Be King Sean Connery 

Sponsored by Valley Translator 

1)' -e-- 
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IF this is your 
retirement olan..; 

Why not give your financial fut-
ure a little more security ...and 
a lot more money? Open your 
Individual Retirement Account 
now and save on taxes as you 
save for your retirement years. 

eoples 
tcite 

/kik of Turkey, II, S.A. 
6:x 159 • l'h:ze16061122 1221 • Turkey, Texas 79261 

Member rptc 
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The Superintendent's 
Corner 

by Wilburn Leeper 

Just how valuable is the 
teaching of Vocational Agricul-
ture in the public school today? 

The teaching of Vocational 
Agriculture was started as a 
program to dissiminate agricul-
tural innovations throughout the 
farming regions and to provide 
an education more relevant to 
rural life rather than city types 
of education provided. Further, 
students are encouraged to make 
independent decisions and take 
initiative. There is little doubt 
that Vocational Agriculture has 
been effective in its contribution 
to the growth of agriculture in 
America. 

Not only has Vocational Agri-
culture contributed to a more 
productive agricultural America, 
but students who take part in its 
many activities also benefit. 
Education Week, which is a 
national education newspaper, 
says that "one of the most 
important features of Vocational 
Agriculture is the Future Far-
mers of America, which provides 
leadership training. The success 
of former FFA students is 
legendary—in the South alone its 
alumni includes Gov. James Hunt 
of North Carolina, Gov. Robert 
Graham of Florida and former 
President Jimmy Carter." The 
article further states that "Sears, 
Roebuck and Co. in Atlanta 
would hire any applicant wearing 
an FFA jacket to an interview." 
Beyond the training in leadership 
and productive agriculture, this 
program is strong in basic 
:cademic classroom training and 
compliments the other compon-
ents of the students' education. 

Today in America and especial. 
ly Texas, there are many political 
leaders who say that vocational 
agriculture has outlived its use-
fulness in its present form and 
that reform is iminent. They 
continue their attack upon the 
program by advocating that 
academic reform should take a 
higher priority when funds are  

divided 	for distribution 	to 
schools and that if funds are not 
sufficient then Vocational Agri-
culture should suffer first. Grant-
ed, academic education should go 
forward with full speed but there 
must be a place reserved for a 
program such as Vocational Agri-
culture. Students do not have to 
chose the vocation of farming in 
order to gain valuable benefits 
from the program. 

The past Legislature provided 
money to fund the vocational 
programs but it was by far 
insufficient to meet the needs. 
There was a promise, however, 
to evaluate the program needs 
and take another look at ade-
quately funding the program 
during the next legislative ses-
sion. We. in the rural areas, see a 
continuing struggle to keep this 
worthwhile program as a viable 
part of our schools. The Valley 
Vocational Agriculture teacher, 
Glen Braune, along with other 
teachers and state leaders are 
forever working hard to keep a 
program in which they believe. 
Jay Eudy. former Valley Ag 
teacher and currently the state 
Vocational Agriculture director, 
has used his position of leader-
ship to see that what he believes 
in is not lost without a fight. This 
program and its struggle could 
not have a better man on its side 
than Jay Eudy. 

• 
The attendance at Valley dur-

ing the month of October has 
been excellent and parents are to 
be commended for observing the 
attendance laws under which the 
school is now operating. 

Tutoring classes are now in full 
swing at Valley and are available 
to every student on Tuesday and 
Thursday mornings at 7:45. This 
program could be mandated, if 
the school hoard so desired, for 
students who are failing but the 
board has chosen to allow 
student participation on an op-
tional basis for the time being. 
Teachers are anxious to help and 
it's a great opportunity for 
students who need assistance in 
difficult areas of study. 

• 

There are now 327 students 
enrolled at Valley. Before the 
year started it was projected 
that somewhere around 290 
average daily attendance would 
be tops but it appears that 
figures will be surpassed when 
all the October attendance fig-
ures are complete. That's good! 

It was good to see the fan 
support and encouragement dur-
ing the Valley 14.7 win over 
Crowell last Friday night. It was 
a very exciting game. The Valley 
players showed lots of character 
and deserved to win this impor-
tant district game. This week we 
play Knox City at Knox City. 
Remember that Knox City beat 
Valley in the play-offs last year! 

Last Friday was the letter "D" 
day in the kindergarten class and 
all the kinder-dads were invited 
to eat lunch with the class. It was 
a good turnout with 19 dads 
responding to the invitation. The 
kindergarten class has celebra-
ted the letter "A" day where 
they enjoyed eating an apple, 
and the letter "C" day when each 
student wore a cap to school. 
Wonder what letter is coming up 
next! 

• 

The school board has adopted a 
policy concerning make-up work 
for unexcused absences. Accord-
ing to the policy, if a student 
receives an unexcused absence, 
he will be allowed to make up all 
missed work but 30 points will 
automatically be taken off the 
grade made on the make-up 
lessons. Make-up work must be 
completed no later than the next 
scheduled tutorial class. 

Channel 60 To Be 
Listed In 
Valley Tribune 

The Valley Translator System 
is sponsoring a schedule for the 
new Channel No. 60, which is 
now KOKH-25. 

The schedule will be printed in 
the Valley Tribune each week 
and will be the channel prime-
time movie listing. 

This will be the only schedule 

available, through the newspa-
per. 

Please cut the listings out each 
week for your convenience. Soon 
a monthly schedule of the 
morning listings will be printed, 
one time each month. 

This is being done at great 
expense for YOUR convenience. 

 —o 

Mr. and Mrs. N. A. Shackel-
ford, Fred and Steven Davidson 
of Amarillo spent Saturday night 
in Quitaque as guests of Mrs. 
Estelle Davidson. 

Ilfr-NR ALL GRIND! 

121 Folger 
%Ini  Coffee 
COFFEE CRYSTALS 

Folger's 

Boneless Chuck 
STEAK 
$1.89 lb. 

  

DR. 0. R. McINTOSH 
Optometrist 

  

  

316 South Main Street 
	

Phone 983-3460 
FLOYDADA, TEXAS 

  

     

  

PROCTOR ELECTRONICS 
T.V. - Radio Repair 

RCA Televisions For Sale 

Quitaque, Texas 	455-1445 

  

     

  

SEED WHEAT 
Cleaned and Certified TANI 105 

Bulk Only 	... 	$5.60 per ho. 

%. .N.S. Wheat "Combine Run" for use by 
"Whirlybird Seeding" in Cotton Land 

Bulk Only 	 $4.25 per ho. 

  

  

VALLEY MILL & ELEVATOR, Inc. 
Box 372 	806-423-1221 	Turkey, Tx. 79261 

  



I HUHN' 	, I N"IONE:II IN. 19%4 

6-Pack 

179 
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BUY ONE GET ONE FREE 

Bounce 
SCENTED FABRIC 2$ 2  

40 CT 	
49 

Softener BOXES 

• 
7,,cticvf,  

Regular or Sugar Free 

PILLSBURY WITH ICING 

Cinnamon Rolls 91/2 OZ $ 19 
CAN 

CONDITIONING OR LOTION 
$ HEAD 	7 OZ 1 Shampoo  SHOULDERS BTL 	

99  
TUBE HEAD & SHOULDERS 

Shampoo 	4T ZE $ 1 99  

1 LB. 
BOX 

PARKAY 

$199 Extra Lean 
GROUND BEEF 

$1.59 lb. 

REG OR LIGHTS 

Fritos 5 1 -g $ 1 49  

KRAFT MARSHMALLOW 

Creme 
7 OZ 
JAR 69' 

MILK 

11111"101 ALL GRINDS 

Folgers 
Coffee 

COFFEE CRYSTALS 

Folger's 

Boneless Chuck 
STEAK 
$1.89 lb. 

KRAFT QUARTERS 

Pa rkay 
Margarin 

PRINTS OR ASST. TOWELS 

Spillmate 
JUMBO 694 

ROLL 

SALT PORK I 

32 oz. Banquet 

FRIED 
CHICKEN $3'99 

9' 
CERTIFIED QUALITY SLICED 

Wilson's S 	19 
12 OZ1 

Bologna PKG.  

SPAM 
Luncheon , oz994 
Meat 	CAN 

Large 

Grade A 

EGGS 
69c doz. 

Giant 
TIDE 
$1.99 

64 oz. 
DOWNEY 

$1.89 
POT ROAST, PORK CHOPS, CHICKEN 

Seasoning SCHILLING 	fh 1 OZ 
ENV. ;&  

l'rices Effective Oct. 19-20. 1984 

ler - .BEER  18,1184 
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GET THE PAINT, GET THE PICTURE 
KODAMATIC" 

PARTYSTAR " 
INSTANT CAMERA 
• Boon m electronoc hash 
• Flash ever, brne convenience 
• Automatic exposure control 
• Moloraed pant detiven/ 
• Compact folding destun 

la residents add Sr 20 In a, Sales la, 

Send in drool of purchase (sales 
reoe,pn for one gallon of Glidden 
peon!. ltdden name cut from I 
label alongwith 619 95 Concludes shtp. 
ping, in Glidden/Kodak PO SO, 
90410.51 Paul. MN 55190 and receive 
Ibis KodarnalictuPAFITYSTAppa 
instant camera. 559 95 value Oiler 
ends December 31 1984 Allow 49 
weeks for delivery 

Kodamatic '59.95 1995* 
value for only 

FAN 

Kodak 

(At kNI) PI1111.s 	• 
To lie GIs to Av. a, 

Saturday at 5:00 p.m . 

Model #534 Skil Saw 
McCullock ProMac 110 I 

xsEIM. DIsPF.NsI 

Masking Paper ,  

The easy-to-use masking dispen-
ser. Makes painting fast and 
easy. Protects surfaces against 
damage caused by paint runs, 
drips, roller mist and overspray. 
Uses inexpensive disposable 
masking paper in 3" to 18" 
widths, and blades, 1/4" to 2" 
tape. Greatly reduces cleanup 
time. $9.95 

Heavy duty reinforcing spring 
maintains proper tension on 
tines. Stress bar maintains fac-
tory set positioning of tines. 
Positive bolt-through-the-handle 
construction locks head tightly. 
Ilandle is 54 in. $4.99 

0% FATHER STRIPPING 
(Convenience) 
Touch N' Peel 

Transparent peelable sealant. 
Seals windows and sliding glass 
doors. Peels off easily without 
harm to paint, wood or metal. 
Perfect bead control—no gun 
needed. Conforms easily to sur-
face irregularities. Ideal as a 
temporary or seasonal sealant. 

$2.50 

Sets rapidly. Will not crystalize, 
weather resistant, dries color-
less. no mixing required. Bonds 
wood, masonite. form:. 
leurn, asphalt. etc. 
1110.80 gal. 	 $3.5-I .12 oz. 
S 2.X0 16 oz. 	52.08 12 oz. 

No caulking gun necessary. 
Touch N' Caulk utilizes a plastici-
zer-free formulation, and is not 
subject to plasticizer migration 
problems. Use with all paints. 
Mildew growth resistant. Low 
shrinkage. Low temperature 
flexibility. Has a resistance to 
discoloration due to aging or 
ultraviolet exposure. Superior 
elongated with h good tensile and 
recovery properties. Touch 
Caulk acrylic resin is 100% 
acrylic and will not crack with 
age. $2.50 

CARPET Reg. $16.99 yd. 
Installed 

HANDLES Hammer, Ball Pien, 
Rivet Hammer. 

CARPET Reg. $16.99 yd. 
Installed 

HANDLE Sledge Hammer 
32" and 36" 

LATEX CAULK 

FORMBY'S 

OLD MASTER'S 

ALL PURPOSE ADHESI 
Deems 

SUPER GM Des con 

RIVI:T CI'\  

1 	1)t 011( l'ItIZI:S 	I 

I Driiii ings 1-1, on )lour 	I 
i Saturday, Out. 27.9:00 5,00 I 

j 	Must Fie 11i and th Pr 	i 

l'n Fietzi,t IT 
I 	 I 

GENTLE ON 
CARPETS 

TOUGH ON 
DIRT! 

RENT 

Gets carpets clean 
like you've never 
seen! 

CONTACT CEMENT 
(Wilhold Flammable Glue) 

Smooth spreading. Neoprene and 
resin formulation. Permanently 
bonds plastic or venuer laminat-
ed to plywood. hardboards, me• 
tat, plaster. and wood. Heat 
resistant. Waterproof. East dry 
ing. Mfg. to meet 0n\ - t. spec. 
MIMI A 130 A ,tnd M11, A 2 

$15.10 g, ' 

OCTOBER 17 - 27 

ON SALE 
Glidden's 
Best Latex 
Semi-Gloss 

• Resists grease, 

dirt, moisture 

• Applies easily - dries quickly 
• Easy water clean-up 
• Matches Spred Satin colors 

sale $13.29 

Hatchet, 
Chace $1.00 ed 

sale $13.29 

$3.95 C. 

79c 

1/2 Price 

1/2 Price 

$1.49 

69c 
$5.99 

SCOTCH TAPE Transparent, Double Stick, 
Strapping. Package Sealing 1/2 Price 

SHOP BROOM 	 $4.99  

CAPROCK HOME CENTER '1  
OUITAOUE 	POWELL LUMBER P, SUPPLY 806/455-1193 

ON SALE 

Famous Glidden 
Latex Wall Paint 99 

GALLON 

SPRED SATIN 
FACTORY SALE 

• Beautiful, flat finish 

• Scrubs clean, stays colorfast 

• Easy water clean-up 

YARD RAKE 
Spring Brace Deluxei,  

OCTOBER 
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Walter Geissler had eye sun 

r High Plains Baptis 
Hospital in Amarillo on Tuesdal 

of this week and returned home 

 

on Wednesday. 

Mrs. T. W. Bell reported 

h 

her mother, Mrs. Kate Beverly 

sped a few days in the Ha 

County Hospital last week an 
has now returned to the nursin 
home in Clarendon. 

Ellen Smith has been a patier 
in the Hall County Hospital an 
is now back at the nursing hon 
and is improved. 

Mrs. Nettie Lyles is sufferin 
with an injured shoulder. She fe 
at her home recently. 

It has been reported th 
Gordon Hedrick is at Northwe 
Texas Hospital in Amarillo aft 
suffering a stroke last week. 

Lewis Buchanan of Irving, 
former Turkey resident, visite 
friends here Tuesday and Wm 
nesday of last week. 

National Textile 
Week To Be 
Observed In Lubbock 

In celebration of Nations 
Textile Week, October 21-27, lb 
Textile Research Center at Tea 
as Tech is sponsoring a union 
production on Thursday, Octobe 
25,1984 at7:00p.m. at the Texa 
Tech University Center Theater 

The production will be excil 
ing, appealing to all ages, educe 
tional, FREE, and several dm 

event, will be given during th 

by tnhn
stOreps participating in th

w
shi:Ewntphasis will be placed on th 
uuctse.A.s.pectrum of textile in

inth 
s Crafted with 	

pros 
 

You need to see it to believe it 
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"Education is teaching a child how to talk — and then 
how to keep quiet . ' 	 Anonymous 

How many ways to make bingo on a card of 90 numbers? 
44,000,000 1  

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
OCTOBER 18.20904 

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST 
PICNIC SUPPLIES- ICE 
SOFT BRINKS• FRESH 	• 

COOKED FOODS SELF SERVE • 
OAS- PRODUCE- MONEY OMEN 

PAGE SEVEN 

The scarlet petals of the poinsettia are leaves; the flowers 
are the yellow clusters in the center. 

Sixty thousand miles of vessels carry blood to every part 
of the adult body. 

CONVENIENCE STORES 

QT. 
CTN. 

BORDEN'S ORANGE 

Juice or 
BORDEN'S NUTTY BUDDIES OR ICE CREAM 

SANDWICHES 
'8119 PL 

FAMILY SIZE 

vas • —144447, .111

c 
0 " 

C KED FOOD SPECIAL AS FEATIMED ON T.V. 

TEAK CHICKEN FRIED 
ON A NUN "'E 

 EACH 
0 GRADY'S EL THICK AND CRUNCHY ALL FLAVORS 

%' POTATO CHIPS ,EL BAG S  1 
09  

zor 
Agra., 

12 oz. cans 
6 pak 
$1.89 

413. 
AVilati

lOVS1:  59' SOAP 	EACH 

BATH SIZE 

DOVE 

TACO ROLLS 
2 for 89c 

MEDIUM EGGS 
59c dozen 

	 ,MMIOMII■■ 

ASSORTED VARIETIES OF CHIPS 

FRITO LAYS 3Rasi 
BAG 

BUCK LABEL SLICED 

HORMEL a 
BACON 	int 

'Oak 
JUICE 

69 
'A BAL. 
ITL. 

GAL . 

CONOCO 	$2 5 9 
ANTIFREEZE CTN. WO 

6'/2 oz. can 
STARKIST TUNA 

79c each 

59 

t
' 'RER h 9 

THURSDAY, OCTOBER 18, 1984 

With The Sick 
T. W. Bell returned to his 

home Sunday after having sur-
gery at Methodist Hospital in 
Lubbock. He is reported to be 
progressing satisfactorily. 

• 
Mrs. Carrie Nola Salem has 

returned from Methodist Hospi-
tal in Lubbock where she had 
surgery and is recuperating at 
her home. 

• 
Bert Degan was a patient at 

Central Plains Hospital in Plain-
view for several days to have 
tests run and was scheduled to 
return to his home Wednesday of 
this week. 

• 
John Adamson was a patient 

at Central Plains Hospital in 
Plainview for a week. J. R. took 
him to Lubbock for treatment of 
a kidney ailment and he returned 
home on Thursday of last week. 

• 
Walter Geissler had eye sur 

gery at High Plains Baptist 
Hospital in Amarillo on Tuesday 
of this week and returned home 
on Wednesday. 

• 
Mrs. T. W. Bell reported that 

her mother, Mrs. Kate Beverly, 
spent a few days in the Hall 
County Hospital last week and 
has now returned to the nursing 
home in Clarendon. 

• 
Ellen Smith has been a patient 

in the Hall County Hospital and 
is now back at the nursing home 
and is improved. 

• 
Mrs. Nettie Lyles is suffering 

with an injured shoulder. She fell 
at her home recently. 

It has been reported that 
Gordon Hedrick is at Northwest 
Texas Hospital in Amarillo after 
suffering a stroke last week. 
	0 

Lewis Buchanan of Irving, a 
former Turkey resident, visited 
friends here Tuesday and Wed-
nesday of last week. 

National Textile 
Week To Be 
Observed In Lubbock 

In celebration of National 
Textile Week, October 21-27, the 
Textile Research Center at Tex-
as Tech is sponsoring a unique 
production on Thursday, October 
25, 1984 at 7:00 p.m. at the Texas 
Tech University Center Theater. 

The production will be excit-
ing. appealing to all ages. educa-
tional, FREE, and several door 
prizes will be given during the 
event. The prizes will be donated 
by the stores participating in the 
show. 

Emphasis will be placed on I he 
wide spectrum of textile prod-
ucts "Crafted with Pride in the 

You need to see it to believe it. 

The average red-blooded 
American male has from 
4.6 to 6.2 million red 
blood cells per cubic cen-
timeter. The average wo-
man has 4.2 to 5.4 



SPRING FRESH 
WATER AS 
CLOSE AS 
YOUR TAP 

• 
DOne ,  r . 00,Er. 	Ou ,  

w0b21 ,  C 

ICKIF N 1E1% % RI 

.155-1179 
	

Quitaque, Tx. 

SILVERTON WELL SERVICE 

Lem La•  
Jerry Mater 
	

Merle Itaehr 

My ?boar 
92119361 

LoubJ M.... Pump, 

1 ear ■X 

l 'h, 

523 :Iv,  
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Mrs. Baisden Hosts 	 Time For End-Of-Year 
Nuevo Study Club 	Crop, Livestock Reports 

THURSDAY, OCTOBER 18, 1984 

tables, and cash receipts from 
the sale of farm products. 

—0-- 

The Tes., i rop 	 and raf.rriers to return the 
Reporting Service will begin 	mailed questionnaires as soon as 
contacting farmers and ranchers 

	
possible. The reported informa- 

across the state in late Nio ern 
	

tion will be combined for state as 
her for final 1984 crop acreage. 	well as county estimates. 
yield and production totals and 

	
Annual county estimates are 

during December for end of year published for li‘estock.diry 

livestock and poultry inventor) 

information. 
The confidential inter. 

conducted by mail or ir. 

by field enu me rators, pf • 

information used by producers to 

make their production and mar 
keeling plans for the corning year. 

-These sun eys take tin a new 

importance this year. -  Sidle 

Statistician Dennis Findley ail 
ded. - since the prolonged dry 
weather in many areas of the 
state rut crop and forage yields 
and forced heavy culling of 
livestock herds. Producers are 

depending on this information for 
an accurate picture of the 1984 
agricultural situation. We all 

need a sound base to make the 
right decisions for 1985." 

To reduce survey costs, the 
Texas Crop and Livestock Re 

porting Service is urging farmer. 

kr more tempas rfflea/s- 
THESE FAVORITES 

Specials for October 19-20 

Fresh Cut Cap Off 
CLUB STEAKS 	lb. 

Center Cut Fully Cooked 
HAM SLICES 	lb. 

12 oz. pkg. Wilson 
FRANKS 

$2.69 

$2.59 

99c 

Chuck Quality 
GROUND BEEF 	lb. 

Assorted Cut Family Pak 
PORK CHOPS 	lb. 

1# pkg. Hormel Black Label 
BACON 

$1.49 

$1.49 

$1.59 

1/2 gal. Kraft Fresh 1/2 gal. Shurfine Fresh 
ORANGE JUICE $1.69 BUTTERMILK $1.09 

5 oz. can Hormel 14 oz. can Milk 
VIENNA SAUSAGE ea. 49c EAGLE BRAND $1.19 

20c off label 3 oz. jar Lipton Reg. $1.79 12 oz. pkg Frito Lay 
INSTANT TEA $2.19 CORN CHIPS $1.49 

8 oz. Reg/Dip Reg. $1.49 12 oz. cans 6 pak 
O'GRADY'S P/CHIPS $1.29 DR. PEPPER $1.79 

14 oz. Powdered Cleaner 4c off label White/Pink Bath Sz. 
AJAX 49c DOVE  59c 

Central America California Purple Top 
BANANAS 3# 99c TURNIPS 	 lb. 29c 

Sweet Yellow Texas 
ONIONS lb. 19c ('.BBB \(;F: 	 lb. 12c 

C & L FOOD 
MEMBER STORE era= 

d  
In S couple  

t  M" 
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 'Mr.Man
s fling came to Qudaq 

I r-Gordon in Febru 

"h Sdn*the
e son of Mr. and Mrs 

HeEishlanning of Dalhart. 

)Ids. Bradley  Bradleyy 
Observes Birthday t: 

Mr. and Mrs.  C. C. Moss 

W 

iii 

d Dalhart arrived Friday nigh 

FrglaAvnagelfterncooamne to Qu  afternoon 
11,11, 

by  

weekend in the Dick ,, 

home. Mr. and Mrs. Jack B 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack L. Bradley 

o 

Ddhart came at noon Saturda

y 

The group drove to Locluu 
Saturday to help Mrs. J. ' 

and 
anniveanniversary.

The group took birth& ■ 

her 98th birth  

rakes. coffee and ice cream, an  

erred all the residents of the 

some 
iareCs  Center. er . Tkhielly mkaavdee photo rkpk   

including rite generations, fog 

the Valley Tribune when Chi 
atriums are developed. 

Kevin Edwards of 011on spent 

from Wednesday until Sunday 

coiling his grandmother, Mrs. 
Estelle Davidson, in Quitaque. 

Mr and Mrs. Elgin Conner ant 
gain were in Muleshoe Sunday 
lir spoke at the 16th and Avenue 
II  Church of Christ. They were 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Harbin.  

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Stone and 
daughter, Amber, of Sweetwater 
spent the weekend with their  
pareswarie t BMir,. and M .erton anrs. d mJriman

id  

y 

Pa. Mrs. Stone and Amt 

Mrs. Paul A. Ramsey in Quit 

remained to visit all this week. 

d.oJoey 11 a re, 
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opofit ItHd o h  rrf w
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Mrs. Chester Strickland of 

Lubbock was guest speaker at 
the meeting of Nueso Study Club 

in the home of her sister. Mrs. R. 

C. Green, Thursday. October II. 
at 4:00 p.m. She told some 

interesting facts about a recent 
trip to the Holy Land and nearby 
countries, which she and her 
husband made with a tour group. 

She then showed some interest 
Mg slides they took on their 
travels 

Other guests included another 

sister of Mrs. Green. Mr.. 
Gordon Montague of Plainview. 
Mrs. Mary Garrison. also 1,1 
Plain v iew, a sister of Mrs. 
George Setliff, Mrs. David Setliff 
and Mrs. Keith Green. Mrs. W. 
L. Armstrong. president. was in 
charge of the meeting. A letter 
was signed by each member 
present and sent to the City 
Council in support of a city wide 
clean up day. 

Mrs. Green served a delicious 
refreshment plate to ten mem 
hers and the above mentioned 
guests. Mrs. D. C. Powell will be 
hostess and leader for the next 
meeting on October 25. 

Nadine Baisden was hostess to 
the Nuevo Study Club on Sep 

tember 27 in her home. She gas.. 
the program on the Rig fiend 
National Park She •howed 

number of colored pint ores from 

magazines and large maps She 

said there weer, great extremes 

of temperature there. from 100 
to degrees at nIght and 

Nuevo Study Club 
Hears Program On 
The Holy Land 

about the park 
delicious refreshment plate 

was Sr - nr. l 110 Mmes.trgle 

Powell Mal nie Adamson. Lola 

Fl....ker a guest, Earline Walker, 

COUNT% Ql ILTERN 

IN% !TED TO %MOS 

IN 111( 1111 \ F XI.I.s 

County can 

ork .,no coin 
Pete for an array nil prises in a 

regional quill •11.0.4 Januar) 7 

in Wichita Falls.  

The quilt show will he a 

feature of the second annual 
Rolling Plains Cotton Show, to he 
held those dates at the Wichita 
Falls Activity ('enter. said Mary 

Streit, County Extension Agent 
for home economics. The Cotton 

Show is conducted h) the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service 
to promote cotton. a mayor 
commodity in the Rolling Plains. 

The quilt show will include 
seven categories: individual 

hand made quilt. individual ma-
chine made quilt, group hand-
made quilt, individual hand-made 
baby quilt, individual machine 

made baby quilt. individual crea-
tive quilt, and antique quilt. 

Prizes will he awarded in the 
amount of $25 for first place in 
each category, $15 for second 

place in each category, $100 for 
Rest of Show, and $75 for 

runner-up.' 
Each entry must be tagged 

with a muslin or fabric label sewn 
on the hack with the name. date 

completed, county and category 

typed on it. The Texas Air -rico' 

tural Extension Service is not 
responsible for lost, stolen or 

damaged quilts. 
Persons interested in entering 

the quilt show can do so by 
obtaining entry forms from their 
County Extension Agent for 

home economics. Entry forms 

may he returned to their County 
Extension office or mailed to 

Mary Streit. Texas Ae: SI Univer 

sity Agricultural Research and 
Extension Center. flux 2159. 
\'ernon. Texas 76384. 

Entry deadline is December I 

Judy Gafford. Louise Meacham. 

Marjorie Rain, Virginia Megan. 

Ella Colvin. Fay e Armstrong. 

ff•ssie Mae Robertson. Marcella 
Patterson and Eat Heen Green 

Wes 
The word delta describes 
a stretch of land, usually 
shaped like a rough tri-
angle, built up by mud and 
sand at the mouth of e 
Mier 

Visiting in the Roy Smith 
home user the weekend were his 
brothers. lard and Marjorie 

smith of Redwood, California, 
..rod their son. !Fermi, of I Fyn% er. 

',hired.. and Guy and Pauline 

smith of Turkey. his sister, 

Il•rtha"burner of Amarillo and 

her daughter in law. Gina Sue 

I urn., of lockney . and her 

granddaughter. Stephanie. of 

Anton 

The smith children were pre, 

ern also the y  are lara Mae and 

11 dim. Itrad•haw. J ('i.e add 

%nna Leta of Flo. dada. P.n and 

I...11171, lteek and \ oihor t.1 

Florn.a 

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Don 
Das ulson of Sterling City spent 
from Friday night through Sun 

Ass as gu•st ,  in the h • of his 

parents. Mr and Mrs J1111111, 

has idson in Quitaque 

Mr and Mrs„ Dwain !lender 
son of Sikerton and Lotto. 

Owens drose to semi rode and 

attended the funeral s•ry ices for 

Uharies Scott Friday Mr Scott 

was buried at Plains iew and the, 

attended the s-rstet The ir  

daughter and granddaughter. 

Sonya fIrnderson, them 

there 

V. r !.Is e 11.reen Stamp. 

I •••uble "tamp. oa Voeciroeuda•• 
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DEBBIE CAGLE 
is now employed at 

KATHY'S BEAUTY SHOP 
in Quitaque 

Walk-ins welcome. Your business Appreciated. 
For Appointments, call 469-5373 or 

KATHY'S BEAUTY SHOP 
455-1305 on Thursdays and Fridays 

deTT471=r *-1=r***************** 
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*GROUP CHARGE 
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PHOTOS 

* 
* * 

$ 5 9 9: 

99f Deposit 

5" Due At * 

Pick up 

Plus Tax * 
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Two Locations 
LACY'S DRY GOODS 

Monday, October 29 	 Turkey 

CAPROCK FOOD 

Tuesday, October 30 

PHOTO HOURS: 9-6 
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Mrs. Veronica Mondragon and 
Roger Manning were united in 
marriage on Tuesday. October 9. 
1984. at the Silverton Schooler 
Gordon Funeral Home. of which 
Mr. Manning is manager. James 
Edwards. justice of the peace, 
read the ceremony. Attendants 
were Mr. and Mrs. Manuel Cruz. 

Mr. Manning came to Quitaque 
with Schooler-Gordon in Febru 
ary. He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Glenn E. Manning of Dalhart. 

Mrs. Bradley 
Observes Birthday 

Mr. and Mrs. C. C. Moss of 

Anson and Mrs. Leslie Heard of 
San Angelo came to Quitaque 
Friday afternoon to spend the 

eekend in the Dick Taylor 
horn, Mr. and Mrs. Jack Bradley 
of Dalhart arrived Friday night. 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack L. Bradley of 
I tail-tart came at noon Saturday. 
The group drove to Lockney 
Saturday to help Mrs. J. T. 
Bradley celebrate her 98th birth-
day anniversary. 

The group took birthday 
cakes, coffee and ice cream, and 
served all the residents of the 
Care Center. They made photo-
graphs and will hasp some. 
including five generations, for 
the Valley Tribune when the 
pictures are developed. 

Kevin Edwards of Olton spent 
from Wednesday until Sunday 

visiting his grandmother. Mrs. 
Estelle Davidson. in Quitaque. 

--n---- 
Mr. and Mrs. Elgin Conner and 

girls were in Muleshoe Sunday. 
He spoke at the Ifit h and Avenue 
D Church of Christ. They were 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 

Harbin. 

----0---- 
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Stone and 

daughter. Amber, of Sweetwater 
spent the weekend with their 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Stone in Silverton and Mr. and 

Mrs. Paul A. Ramsey in Quita-
que. Mrs. Stone and Amber 
remained to visit all this week. 

—o— 
Joey Barefield of WTSU in 

Canyon spent the weekend in 
Quitaque with his parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. James Barefield. 

Mr. and Mrs. James W 
Kimbell of Quitaque and Mr. and 

Mrs. David Set liff of Turku 
attended the wedding of Mr ,  
Kimbell's niece, Terri Win 
Smith and William Kirk Gordon 

at Floydada Saturday evening 
The bride is the daughter of Mr 
and Mrs. Neal Smith. jr. of 

Floydada. 

Visitors of the Jame, W 

Kimbells Sunday were her sister. 
Mrs. Bea Strain of Port ales, Nev 

Mexico. and the Kimbell's grand 
daughter, Doneta Wallace of 
Tulia. 

—o 
Mrs. Maida Allen and daugh 

ter. Mrs. Lester. of Mobeet 
visited Mr. and Mrs. hero' 
Hamilton Saturday. 

Mrs. Mondragon is the daugh-
t er of Domingo Castillo of 
Quitaque and Lucia Castillo of 
Pampa. She has one child. Lance. 

The couple will make their 
home in Quitaque. 

He is manager of Schooler-Gor-
don Funeral Homes in Silverton 
and Quitaque. 

—o--- 

TRIPLE L CLUB 

WILL MEET THURSDAY 

OF NEXT WEEK 

Everyone 55 years of age or 
older is invited to the First 
Baptist Church Thursday of next 
week for food, fun fellowship. 
Bring a covered dish. 

After the meal. there will he 
games and a time of fellowship. 

EDITORS 

(clipped) 

Newspaper editors must be--
Forever on the ball-- 
Because they deal with everyone 
However large or small-- 
They must be diplomatic and--
know how to second guess--
while exercising what is known--
as freedom of the press-- 
they guide a paper's policy--
on politics and news-- 
through editorials they give--
the world their honest views--

It has been said an editor--
can make his paper great - 
indeed, he holds a power that--
is hard to estimate-- 
Unsung as far as honor goes--
but nonetheless renown-- 

the editors throughout the land--
wear respect for a crown- 
And so it is I pen these lines--

for editors to see- 

may Godly guidance rule their 

hearts-- 
in all the days to be. 

Mrs. Verlon Hamilton of Roan-
oke spent Saturday night in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Leroy 
Hamilton in Quitaque. 

-0- 

Visitors in the home of Mrs. 
Ella Mason Saturday were her 
daughters and families, Mr. and 
Mrs. Leon Turner of Childress 
and Mrs. S. L. Causey and 
daughter. Liz. and daughter-in-
law. Maria Causey. all of Amaril-
lo. 

Outstanding 4-H members 
leaders in Briscoe County were 
recognized at the annual Achi 
evement Banquet Sunday night 
with some 100 4-Wers, their 
families and guests on hand for 
the awards presentations. 

Master of ceremonies for the 
event was Stephen Stephens. Cal 
Brannon gave the invocation. 
The pledge of allegiance was led 
by Jeannita Stephens and the 
4-H pledge by Melannie Daniels. 

Kathy Brown extended the 
welcome, and Jeff Fuston intro-
duced the special guests. 

Kori Baird recognized the 
many businesses, organizations 
and individuals who supported 
the 4-H program during the past 
year. 

Organizational leaders Kathy 
Frizzell and Juanita Gray pres-
ented award medals to 47 county 
youth who had qualified for 
district competition in a variety 
of 4-H contests. 

Kathy Frizzell made a special 
presentation of trophies to the 
six members of the state-placing 
Share-the-Fun team: Kathy 
Brown. Jeannita Stephens. Don-
na Tomlin, Kristy Fogerson, 
Melannie Daniels and Cal Bran-
non. 

A special Alumni Award was 

presented to Wayne Nance by 

One Minute 
Sports Quiz 

1. Who won the B. C. Open golf 
tournament? 
2. Who won the LPGA Rail 
Charity Classic? 
3. Who started as quarterback in 
the Cowboys' opening game? 
4. Who won the Southern 500 
stock car race? 
5. Who recently hit his 300th 
career home run? 

See Answers On Neat Page 

ANSWERS TO SPORTS QUIZ 

1. Wayne Levi. 
2. Cindy Hill. 
3. Gary Hogeboom. 
4. Harry Gant in a Chevrolet. 
5. Jim Rice. Boston Red Sox. 

AMEN p 
rit7 NOT c2, 5Tue. 

Some people have be-
!eyed that diamonds grow 
if left undisturbed in the 
soil. 

Kristy Fogerson. 
The Extension Agents gave 

the "I Dare You" awards to 
Jeannita Stephens and Todd 
Reagan. 

David Schott recognized Ro-
bert Gilmore as the 1984 "Friend 
of 4-H" for his contribution of 
handmade spurs and hits to help 
with the stock show equipment 
project. 

Donna Tomlin acknowledged 
the adult leaders who had helped 
with the 4-H projects and activi-
ties during the past year. 

The outstanding leader aw-
ards, the Silver Spurs, were 
presented to Lee O'Neal and 

John 	by Mike Ferguson of 
Swisher Electric Cooperative 
and Jimmy Ross of Lighthouse 
Electric Cooperative, both spon• 
sors of this annual award. 

The final award of the evening 
was the announcement of the 
Gold Star Award for top 4-H 
members in the county. Commis-
sioner Bryant Eddleman present. 
ed the Gold Star pins to Roger 
Hughes and David Schott. These 
young men will receive further 
recognition at the District Gold 
Star Banquet in Lubbock Novem-
ber 19. 

Jamie Frizzell closed the ban-
quet by leading I he 4 II proN ■ -r.  

  

Outstanding 4-H Members 

Honored At Banquet 

Couple Wed In Silverton 
Tuesday Of Last Week 

 

  

WHEAT SEED 
$6.00 per bushel 

Cleaned, treated and bagged 

$5.00 per bushel 
In bulk, cleaned 

LOCKNEY COOP 



Austrca I A 
ArriericA 

AntarcticA  	
Aks 
Ettropt 

row] Richie Hill, Russell Patrick, 
Colter Gilmore, Randi Brooke 
Powell, Micah Stark, Lindsey 
Jennings, Walt Henson, Bobby 
Martin and Russell Ramsey. 

The first letter of every 
continent's name is the 
same as the last: AmericA, 
AntarcticA, EuropE, AsiA, 
AustraliA, AfricA. 

Some say its a sign of rain 
to see lightening bugs 
flying high. 

Energas Company hereby 
gives notice of its intent to 
implement new rates for do-
mestic and commercial type 
customer classes residing in 
the unincorporated areas of its 
West Texas System. It is anti-
cipated that the new rates will 
result in approximately a two 
tenths of one percent ).2%l in-
crease in Energas Company's 
gross revenues, which increase 
is not a -major change" as 
defined in Section 43 (b) of Ar-
ticle 1446c, V.A.T.C.S 

A Statement of Intent to 
change said rates was filed 
with the Railroad Commis-
sion of Texas on or about 
September 21, 1984• and is 
available for inspection at the 
Company's Amarillo office. 
301 S. Taylor Street. Further 
information may be obtained 
from the Railroad Commis-
sion of Texas, Gas Utilities 
Division, P.O. Drawer 12967, 
Capitol Station. Austin, 'Maas 
78711. 

The proposed increase will 
not become effective until 
or except to the extent that 
t he same rates are approved 
for service within the munici-
palities on the West Texas. 
System. 

UNINCORPORATED 
AREAS OF THE 

FOLLOWING CITIES 
AND TOWNS ARE 

AFFECTED: 
Abernathy 
Amherst 
Anton 
Big Spring 
Fiovina 
Brownfield 
Canyon 
('oahoma 
('rosbyton 
Dimmitt 
Earth 
h:dmonson 
Floydada 
Forsan 
Friona 
!foie Center 
I lappy 

I fart 
I lereford 
ldalou 
Kress 
bake 
Tanglewood 

Iamesa 
I evelland 
Littlefield 
I oak ney 
I ,orenzo 
Lubbock 
M eadow  eadow 
Nlidland 
'01,1k-shoe 
\ azareth 

New Deal 
New Home 
Odessa 
O'Donnell 

Olton 
Pampa 
Panhandle 

Petersburg 
Plainview 
Pont 
Quitaque 
Rolls 
Ransom 
Canyon 

Ropesville 

Seagra, 
Seminole 
ShaBowater 
Silvertor, 
Slaum 
Smyer 
Springlake 
Stanton 
Sudan 

.nmf • rl r., k 

'ha rken 
Vega 

V. ilvon 
Vlollforth 

Boy v and girls of the Children's 
Rainbow Preschool enjoyed a 
ride on the Silverton firetruck 
recently with Fire Chief Dwight 
Ramsey and Firemen James 

The Progressive Extension 
Homemakers will sponsor the 
annual Halloween Carnival on 
Saturday. October 27. at the 
Briscoe County Show Barn in 
Silverton. The carnival will open 
at 7:30 p.m. Admission will be 
25c. 

A costume contest will be held 
at 8:15 p.m. Anyone wishing to 
enter this contest will be charged 
50e. The categories will be 
divided into four age groups: 
preschool, kindergarten - third 
grade; grade four through eight; 
and adult. Prices for first. second 

Veterans concerned about 
their families' well-being after 
they are gone can ease their 
worry by safeguarding basic 
documents relating to military 
service, life insurance and Veter-
ans Administration correspon-
dence. says Stephen Lemons, 
Director of the Waco VA Region 
al Office. 

Securing papers, marriage cer-
tificates or child custody evi-
dence from fire, theft or loss 
could be one of the most 
important legacies a veteran can 
leave the family, according to 
Lemons. Other documents that 
should be protected and filed 
with family papers are govern 
ment and commercial life incur 
Imre policies, any VA correspon 
diner with identif,, clkl, 
numbers or social sts:.• 
hers. wills and where .11-i• 
nat ural izat ion papers. 

The regional 	 or 

Edwards and Anthony Kingery. 
They are (back row, left to right] 
Gail Wyatt, teacher; Traci Ham, 
Dara Ramsey, Amy Stark, Holly 
Tiffin and Tre‘. Wyatt; 'front 

and third place in each category 
will be given. 

A fee of 55.00 will be charged 
for booth rental space, to help 
pay for the use of the barn. 
Anyone wishing to have a booth 
should call Marsha Brunson, 
823 2463. 

The barn will be open at 10:00 
a.m. Saturday for those wishing 
to set up booths early. Everyone 
having a booth will be respon-
sible for their own booth and is 
asked to clean up around the 
booth after t he carnival. 

tecting documents—and inform-
ing the family—can do much to 
avoid anguish during times of 
emotional stress," said Lemons. 

He said veterans should en-
courage family members to seek 
information and assistance con-
cerning benefits at the Waco VA 
Regional Office. That office can 
be reached toll free by using the 
number listed in the local tele-
phone directory. 

Thousands of Texans are get -

ting a head start on Christmas by 
placing mail or phone orders for 
gifts now so they will get here in 
time for the holidays. 

Most of these customers will 
be satisfied with the merchan-
dise they order, but some will be 
disappointed. And whether they 
can get any satisfaction for their 
complaints or not will depend on 
how they placed their orders, 
says Texas A&M University 
Agricultural Extension Service 
home economist Nancy L. Gran-
ovsky. 

Many mail-order companies 
now offer toll-free telephone 
numbers for easy ordering. "Us-
ing the telephone may seem 
more convenient than ordering 
by mail," she says. "but it's also 
riskier, since phone orders are 
not covered by the Federal 
Trade Commission's mail-order 
rule." 

The mail-order rule—which 
applies only to orders placed 
through the mail, or shipped 
through the mail—requires com 
ponies to ship your order within 
the time they promise, or within 
30 days after they receive your 
order, Granovsky explains. So if 
you order gifts by mail in 
October, you can be reasonably 
sure they will arrive in time for 
Christmas. 

If the company must delay 
shipment, the mail order laws 
require that you be notified and 
allowed to either give your 
consent, or cancel your order for 
a full refund, she adds. 

When you order by phone, you 
aren't covered by this rule and 
you assume responsibility for 
merchandise that is not delivered 
or is delivered late, cautions the 
home economist. So television 
ads that say "allow four to six 
weeks for delivery -  may not 

THURSDAY. OCTOBER 18, 1984 

make good on their promise. 
If you receive unsatisfactory 

merchandise, you can ask the 
company for a refund, just as 
customers who order over the 
phone can. But mail order 
customers can also look to the 
post office for assistance if the 
company does not satisfy their 
complaints. notes Granovsky. 

Since not every complaint 
results in an investigation and 
not all investigations result in 
refunds, the best policy for 
consumers is to be careful, 
whether they order by phone or 
mail, she says. 
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Club To Sponsor Annual 
Halloween Carnival 

Veterans Can Leave Families 

More Than Memories 

WHEAT SEED 

	

Registered 	TAM 105 
Bulk Only . . . .$5.60 per bu. 

	

V.N.S. Wheat 	Bulk Only 
$4.25 per bu. 

FEED 
We are now contracting 

Range Cubes, Protein Blocks, 
etc. Call, or come by for prices. 

VALLEY MILL & ELEVATOR, Inc. 

Box 372 
	

806 423-1221 	Turkey 

CONNER INSURANCE AGENCY 

LIFE 	 HEALTH 
AUTO 	 PROPERTY 
For Your Convenience, Proof of Liability 
Insurance is Enclosed with Each Auto Policy. It 
is Important For You to Take Time to Replace 
These Certificates at Each Renewal Date. 
Phone 455-1100 	Quitaque, Texas 79255 

Mail, Phone Order Protection 
Not Always The Same 

A day t  • „ half-dog° 

 ruins, a line campe,r, 



1 1 x 1 4 
Wall Portrait 

in 
Living Color 

a' 

Never before 
offered at 
this Price! 

AT 

990 
Plus 760 for handling 

✓rhs very spec.at 	
ou 

.s Pre- 
nted as an exp ∎ essoon 01 	 r 

, ants for your patronage 

Compare at $25 OW 

• FREE to all Senior Citizens 

• NO EXTRA CHARGE for groups 

• LIMITED OFFER one per subject, 

one per family 

MERRELL FOOD 
135 Main Street 	 Quitaque 

WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 24 
11-1 a.m. and 2 -6 p.m. 

When it came time 
to stand and choose, 

Lloyd Doggett 
stood with you. 

ELDERLY 
* Lloyd Doggett fought to 

preserve the fiscal integrity of 

all Texas retirement systems 

and believes that Social Security 

"is a sacred contract we cannot 

turn our backs on." 

EDUCATION 
* Lloyd Doggett has always been 

one of Texas' leading advocates 

of a first class public education 

system. As a State Senator, he 

has been in the forefront of the 

struggle to improve the quality 

of teaching for our children. 

PUTS TEXAS FIRST 
* In his eleven years as a Texas 

Senator, Lloyd Doggett has 

always put the needs and con-

cerns of Texas first and the 

greedy special interest~ last. 

Lloyd has written and fought to 

pass 125 people-helping laws, 

including the Consumer Protec-

tion Act, utility reform, and the 

Human Rights Commission 

When it came time 
to stand and choose, 

Phil Gramm 
stood against you. 

ELDERLY 
• Gramm led the fight to cut 

Social Security benefits out 

from under the most vulnerable 

people in our society. In fact, he 

has voted against Social Secu-

rity on at least eight occasions. 

EDUCATION 
• Gramm has been relentless in 

his efforts to remove all Federal 

assistance to education, going so 

far as to exclaim that educa-

tional assistance to the handi-

capped "(encourages) people to 

be handicapped." 

PUTS TEXAS LAST 
♦ Gramm's record stands as a 

monument to callousness and 

insensitivity to the needs and 

concerns of ordinary Texans. 

He voted against helping 

drought-stricken Texas farmers 

and ranchers, border busineses 

hurt by the peso devaluation, 

and against loans to small 

businesses across Texas. 

Vote Lloyd Doggett for U.S. Senate 
Pui Ad, Pd lor b Ilthd 1,,gen C.mp.nen Fund 000,111,h %,,,,- , qu.tin Tt •,s. '1001 
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A day at the ranch, including 
Indian camp sites, half-dugout 
ruins, a line camp. chuckwagon 
grub. buck-skinners and cow 
boys. is on tap for history buffs 
October 27 at the old Mott 
division of the Matador Ranch. 

Reservations must be made (or 
tours which will begin about 
every 30 minutes from the 
cattleguard 20 miles east of 
Floydada or 12 miles west of 
Matador on US 62/70. A sign will 
mark the turnoff for the heritage 
journey sponsored by members 
of the Daughters of the Republic 
of Texas. 

The day is planned as a 
heritage project on Texas history 
with an emphasis on West Texas 
life from the Indian to the nester. 
Groups already signing up in-
clude junior historians, Texas 
history students, scouting and 
heritage organizations. 

The look at the past begins 
with Indian campsites where 
Wayne Parker, a descendant of 
Commanche war-chief Quanah 
Parker will paint a few faces and 
will show how to follow animal 
and people signs. 

At the half-dugout ruins, Linda 
Moore will head up activities that 
might have gone on when the 
homestead first was built into 
the Chimney Creek canyon wall. 

Today, the fireplace and two 
walls remain near a giant pecan 
tree that shades the rocks 
marking the hand-dug well. 
Behind the dugout, other rock 
walls indicate what could have 
been a spring house for keeping 
food. 

From the dugout. visitors will 
move to the chuckwagon for a 
sampling of cowboy grub, hard-
tack, son-of-a-gun stew and 
beans. Fiddling and cowboys will 
complete the scene. 

At the buckskinner tent, his-
tory buffs will get a lesson in how 
it was to live off the land while 
learning about hunting methods. 

The Cottonwood Mott line 
camp, named for the motto of 
trees growing around its weep-
ing springs, could provide the 
drama of any wild west movie 
with its story of a shootout 
between cowboys over the sing-
ing of "Yankee Doodle" too soon 
after the Civil War to suit one of 
them. 

Both died in the shootout and 
were buried side by side in a 
grave 18 inches deep. A new 
wagon sheet, torn half in two, 
provided their shrouds and cof-
fin. 

Visitors won't be able to see 
the graves, however. since the 
bodies were dug up and moved 
later. But the stump of a tree. 
said to contain lead from the 
shootout, is preserved for his-
tory. 

When 15 corporations were 
formed to sell the Matador, J. C. 
and W. E. Burleson joined with 
Bundy, Harold and Vance Camp -

bell to buy the Mott corporation. 
Marisue Burleson Potts, a 

member of the Daughters of the 
Republic of Texas, and Bundy 
Campbell will be among the hosts 
for the field trip into history. 

Donations of $5.00 for adults 
and $3.00 for youngsters is asked 
for the day's outing. 

Reservations may be made 
with Mrs. S. C. Burleson at 806 
983-2977 or by writing Route L, 
Quitaque, Texas 79255. 

—o 

The first pinball game 
machine was the "Whoo-
pee Game," manufactured 
in 1930 in Chicago . 

Now Is Good 
Time To 
Ammoniate Hay 

Now is a good time for 
livestock owners to ammoniate 
poor quality hay. 

Anhydrous ammonia should be 
readily available to treat hay, 
and treating now will get the hay 
ready for fall feeding, says 
Travis Harney, County Agent 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, Texas A&M 
University System. 

Hay ammoniation involves co-
vering hay bales with black 
plastic and injecting anhydrous 
ammonia. 

The practice can increase 
crude protein, digestibility and 
animal intake, all of which lead to 
increased animal performance. 

Crude protein in hay can be 
increased three to eight percent 
by ammoniation while digestibil-
ity can be increased from three 
to 23 percent. Feeding trials 
have shown an increase in animal 
intake of 20 to 27 percent. 

In feeding studies, steers fed 
ammoniated hay gained one-half 

pound more a day than those on 
the same type of hay but 
untreated. 

Cost varies from $8.00 to 
$14.00 a ton—about $3.65 for the 
plastic and $4.40 to $7.50 for 60 
pounds of anhydrous ammonia 
(or about three percent of the 
weight of the hay). And the 
payoff is an increase in the hay's 
feeding value of $22 to $25 per 
ton. 

Low quality hay is a prime 
candidate for the ammoniation, 
emphasizes Harney. If hay has a 
crude protein of less than eight 
percent, ammoniation will pay. 
—However, Harney cautions ag-

ainst ammoniating sorghum type 
hays because of a potential 
problem in cattle fed such hay. 
Studies have found that the 
ammonia reacts with sugars in 
sorghum hays to sometimes 
cause wild behavior in cattle. 

Keep treated hay covered for 
at least three weeks before 
feeding, recommends Harney. 
Since ammoniated hay becomes 
fairly loose due to a breakdown 
in the fiber content, it will not 
shed water well and should be 
protected from rain. So it's a 

good practice to keep the plastic 
on until feeding time. 

Endometrial Symptoms 
Know the warning signals 
of endometrial cancer. Any 
bleeding between periods, 
excessive bleeding during 
periods, and bleeding after 
menopause should be 
brought to the attention of a 
doctor, advises the Ameri-
can Cancer Society. 

The largest bird in the world, 
the ostrich, is a strange bird, 
says "International Wildlife" 
magazine. A male ostrich typical. 
ly stands seven feet tall, weighs 
260 pounds, runs up to 50 miles 
an hour with strides as long as 15 
feet and packs a kick of up to 500 
pounds per square inch. Yet, the 
bird stops when a person waves a 
thorn-tree branch in its face. 

The Eskimo make and use 
wooden "eyeglasses" 
with only narrow slits for 
eyepieces, to protect their 
eyes from glare reflected 
by ice and snow . 
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Ranch Ruins, Grub, Cowboys 

Allow Peek At Settler's Life 
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NICHOLS 
Tillage Tools 

PLOW SWEEPS 

HARD FACED 

Cash Charge 

	

16" 	12.05 	16.50 

	

18" 	13.99 	19.16 

CULTIVATOR SWEEPS 

PLAIN 

Cash Charge 

8-x3/16 2.41 3.30 
10"x3/16 2.72 3.72 
12"x3/16 3.21 4.40 
16"x1/4 7.39 10.12 
18"x1/4 9.23 12.64 

FURROWS 

Cash Charge 

8" cut 	6.57 	9.00 
10" cut 	6.72 	9.20 

SILVERTON 
METAL WORKS 

WHEAT 
CLEANING 

Bagged or Bulk 
Call Collect For Appointment 

PRODUCERS 
COOPERATIVE ELEVATOR 

983-2821 	Floydada, Texas 
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NOW 
is the time to foliar feed your crops with high 
efficiency Feast Liquid Fertilizer. We can 
recommend the right fertilizer on you can get a 
good return on your fertilizer investment by 
foliar application. Also can be applied with 
Insecticides or Herbicides. 

Custom Applications or we have equipment 
you can use. 

411111■ 	N■ 

■11 E wimmil 
LOYD STEPHENS 

823 - 2431 
	

Factory Direct Prices 

=== 

Our Flowers Say It Best 
Shop At 

FARLEY'S FLOWERS 
& VARIETY 

Wendell, Roberta, Johnnie, Debbie 
(It I FAQL E, TEXAS 

455-1410 

For All Your Flower & Variety Needs 
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FOR SALE 

MASONRY 	PRODUCTS, 
Sand, Gravel, Cement, Paints, 
Lumber, Hardware. Let us re-
model your home or business. 
Turn-key contract work. Foger-
son Lumber & Supply, Silverton, 
823-2021. 46-tfc 

COMMERCIAL PRINTING OF 
ell kinds: Letterheads, envel-
opes, business cards, newslet-
ters, invitations, etc. We will get 
you • cost estimate on any job. 
None too large or too small. The 
Valley Tribune, Phone 423-1287 
or 455-1101. 47-tinc 

SEE OUR BIG SELECTION OF 
La-z-Boy recliners and other 
brands of home furnishings such 
as Broyhill, Bassett, Mastercraft 
and others. See us first. Gable 
Furniture, 7th and Brice, Mem-
phis, Texas. 9-tine 

ALL CERAMIC GREENWARE 
and Porcelain Greenware in the 
Dana pattern 25% off from Oct. 5 
through 20. Two J's China & 
Gifts, Turkey, Texas. 17-3tc 

SWEET POTATOES AND Pea-
nuts For Sale. Four miles south 
of Valley School. Joe Edd Helms, 
469-5387. 18-5tc 

FOR SALE: THREE-SPEED BI-
cycles, one for boy, one for girl, 
$40.00 each or buy pair for 
$70.00; also, one size 5 camel 
colored corduroy blazer, new, 
$15.00. Call Jan Ramsey, 455-
1316 after 5:00 p.m. 19-2tc 

FOR SALE: FROZEN SHELL-
ed pecan halves, one pound bags, 
$4.00. all 455-1414, Mrs. Jo Mae 
Merrell. 19-2tp 

OPEN 1 OUR OWN HIGHLY 
profitable Children's Shop. Baby 
to Pre-Teen. All first quality 
merchandise. Nationally known 
brands. •Health Tex *Buster 
Brown •Her Majesty •Lee *Levi 
• Chic *Jordache *Doe Spun 
• Rob Roy •Izod and many more. 
Furniture, accessories and toys 
by Gerber and Nod-A-Way. 
$14,900.00 includes beginning 
inventory, training, fixtures and 
grand opening promotions. Have 
your store opened in as little as 
15 days. Prestige Fashions, 501 
329-8327. 	 19-1tp 

RICK'S MUFFLER 

For all your exhaust needs, 
including customizing. 

(806) 823-2015 Silverton, Texas 

WE ARE A DEALER FOR 
Semites Wallpaper. Prompt de-
livery. Sample books available. 
Fogerson Lumber & Supply, 
Silverton, Phone 823-2021. 29-tfc 

UNDERGROUND PLASTIC IR- 
rigation Water and Gas Pipe 
Installed. Backhoe Service, Irri- 
gation Leaks and Repairs. 823- 
2431, Silverton Metal Works. 

44-tie 

LOCKNEY MEAT CO. USDA 
Inspected. Kill days Monday 
through Friday. Custom proces- 
sing. Wholesale and Retail 
Meats. Halves and Quarters Cut, 
Wrapped, Frozen and Fully 
Guaranteed. Sam & Kelly For- 
tenberry, owners and managers. 
Phone 652-3305, corner of U. S. 
70 and Farm Road 378 South. 

15-tfc 

SINGER SEWING MACHINES, 
Vacuum Cleaners, Smith Corona 
Typewriters, Adding Machines, 
Kirby Sales and Service. Buy 
here, service here. Call in 
Quitaque, 455-1101, or call 423-
1155 in Turkey. Call 259-2716 in 
Memphis. Office located at 620 
Noel in Memphis. Here every 
two weeks on Thursdays. 28-tfc 

°Deadbolts °Safes 
°Keys °Locks 

0 PRO-LOCK SHOP 

Locksmith 
Security is our Business 

983-3834 	Don Probasco 
15 mi. south of Silverton on 207 

FIVE FAMILY GARAGE SALE 
Thursday, Friday and Saturday, 
October 18-19-20 from 10:00 a.m. 
to 5:00 p.m. in building south of 
Turkey Hotel. 19-1tc 

FOR SALE: 3-BEDROOM Brick 
house, 2 baths, basement, gar-
age, on large lot in Valley View 
Addition in Quitaque. Call E. G. 
Reed, 18061 469-5312 night, or 
write Route 1, Quitaque, Texas 
79255. 32-tfc 

FOR SALE: 3-BEDROOM 
House, some fire damage, priced 
42,000.00. Located First and 
Morris Street, second house 
north in Quitaque. See Ronnie 
Carpenter. 

NOTICE OF 

GENERAL ELECTION 

IAVISO DE 

ELECCION GENERAL) 

To the Registered Voters of the 
County of Briscoe. Texas: 
IA los votantes registrados del 
Condado de Briscoe Texas:1 

Notice is hereby given that the 
polling places listed below will be 
open from 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 p.m., 
November 6, 1984. for voting in a 
general election to elect Mem- 

bers of Congress, Members of 
the Legislature, and state, dis-
trict, county and precinct offi-
cers; and FOR the purpose of 
adopting or rejecting the propos-
ed Constitutional Amendments 
as submitted by the 68th Legis-
lature, of the State of Texas. 

(Notifiquese, por las presente, 
que las casillas electorales sita-
dos abajo se abriran desde las 
7:00 a.m. hasta las 7:00 p.m. el 
6th de noviembre de 1984 para 
votar en la Eleccion General para 
elegir Miembros del Congreso, 
Miembros de la Legislatura, y 
oficiales del estado, distrito, 
condado y del precinct° y PARA 
adoptar o rechazar las enmiendas 
propuestas constitucionales asi 
como fueron sometidas por la 
68th Legislatura, de la Estado de 
Texas.) 

Locations of polling places 
(Direcciones de las casillas 

electorales) 
Election Precincts 
81—Virgil Crow, Silverton, City 
Hall 
82—Elgin Conner, Quitaque, City 
Hall 
#3—Jack Sutton, First State 
Bank, Silverton 
#4—John Wyatt. Towe Building 
85—Harold Edwards, Neal Tay-
lor home. Lake Mackenzie 

/s/Fred W. Mercer 
County Judge 
(Por el Juez del Condado) 

42-ltc 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

The Turkey-Quitaque ISD is 
accepting sealed bids on proper-
ty listed below. Bids may be 
submitted to the school business 
office and will be opened Novem-
ber 12, 1984 during the regular 
board meeting. All property is 
located within the City of Turkey 
and came into the possession of 
the school district via tax sales. 
The school district retains the 
right to accept or reject all bids. 

Lot 	Block Division 	City 

1-2 	13 Bellview Turkey 
6 	16 Bellview Turkey 
12 	5 Hillcrest Turkey 
11 	5 Hillcrest Turkey 
S15' 14 	1 Southside Turkey 
6 	 1 ' Jordan Turkey 
13 N10'14 1 Southside Turkey 
2-3 	3 College Turkey 
1-2 	19 	J&B Turkey 
10 	6 Original Turkey 
11-14-16 	9 	11 J&B Turkey 
1 	 5 Hillcrest Turkey 
11 	3 Threets Turkey 
6 	 I Southside Turkey 
1-2-3-4 	2 College Turkey 
3 	19 " J&B Turkey 
1-2-4-13.14-15 4 	J&B Turkey 

19.tfc 

CARDS OF THANKS 

I came to Tulia, Texas .1 ,  

FmHA County Supervisor Jul 
15, 1969, serving Swisher and 
Briscoe counties. I have apprec ia  

ted working with the farmers. 
rural residents and other lend 
ers. Efforts were made to be fair 
with everyone, including my co-
workers in Farmers Home Ad 
ministration. The policies of the 
administration were honored. 

My family joins me in thanking 
all of you for the courtesie. 
shown us. We love Swisher and 
Briscoe counties. May God bless 
you. 

George H. James, jr. 

NOTICE! 

We Have A New 
Phone Number 

823.2486 

BRISCOE IMPLEW I N I 

• 

00000000 00000000000000 
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