
KNOX CITY Volunteer Firemen worked hard to contain the blaze that destroyed the house occupied by 
Nora Lee Taylor and her seven children early Tuesday morning. Mrs. Taylor and two of her children 
died in the fire. Strong winds whipped the blaze, but firemen prevented its spread to adjoining areas.

Early Tuesday Morning

Fire Claims Three
An early morning fire 

completely destroyed a 
home and claimed three 
lives about 6:30 o’clock here 
Tuesday.

Nora Lee Taylor, 30, and 
two of her children, Kevin, 4, 
and Mekbra, 2, lost their 
lives in the blaze.

Another child, Gerald 
Taylor, 13 months old, was 
taken to the Knox County 
Hospital with second degree 
bums, and Tuesday after­
noon was flown to the bum 
center in Dallas.

Four other children 
escaped without serious in­
jury including Norma Fay, 
14, Billy Ray, 12, Curtis 
Gene, 10, and Ricky Earl, 9.

Bobby Strickland, a 
customer at a nearby con­
venience store, helped Mrs. 
Taylor get the children out, 
except two, and when she 
returned to get them, she 
was unable to get out.

Edina Robinson, a neigh­
bor, took the burned child to 
the hospital.

The alarm was sounded 
approximately at 6:45 a.m., 
according to Knox City 
Volunteer Fire Department 
chief Ken Lawson, and in 24 
degree weather with winds 
gusting to more than 30 
miles an hour, the four-room 
frame dwelling was ‘prac­
tically gone’ by the time 
firemen could arrive. Brief 
snow flurries also added to 
the extreme cold of the early 
morn.

Justice of the Peace Billy

Prices 
Continue 
To Decline

Cotton prices continued to 
decline, according to Sidney 
Ferrell in charge of the 
Munday Marketing Services 
Office. Prices being offered 
ranged from 800 to 875 points 
above CCC loan levels. 
Trading was light.

Grade 42 continued as the 
predominant quality classed 
this week with 41 percent. 
Grade 52 accoimted for 20 
percent and grade 41 was 18 
percent. EUeven percent was 
grade 51. About 34 percent of 
the cotton classed was 
reduced in grade because of 
bark or grass. The 
predominant fiber length 
was staple 32 with 78 per­
cent. Micronaire readings in 
the base range of 35 to 49 
dropped from 69 percent las< 
week to 66 percent this week 
Twenty-five percent tested 
in the 30 to 34 range and 9 
percent was below 30.

About 6100 samples were 
classed during the week en­
ding January 19, bringing 
the season total to 54,100, at 
Munday.

TINY BURNS VICTIM Gerald Taylor was flown from Knox City Municipal 
Airport Tuesday afternoon to Parkland Hospital in Dallas. The helicopter 
pilot was accompanied by an M.D., left, with ail the necessary equipment. 
Knox County Hospital Administrator Glen Rumley, center, and Cliff Ray, lab 
technician, are shown as they assisted in the air lift.

Benson of Benjamin, 
assisted by Knox County 
Sheriff H.C. Stone and City 
Marshal James Redwine of 
Knox City, held an inquest at 
the scene along with Fire 
Chief Lawson.

Services, as of press time 
Tuesday, were tentatively 
set for Wednesday with 
burial in the Knox City 
Cemetery.

Mrs. Taylor was born 
January 2, 1949* in De Kalb, 
Texas. She married Billy 
Taylor in 1964 in Benjamin.

She is survived by six 
children, Harold Wayne 
Collier, Texas School for the 
Blind in Austin, Norma Fay 
Taylor, Billy Ray Taylor, 
Curtis Gene Taylor, Ricky 
Earl Taylor, and Gerald 
Lavor Taylor, all of the 
home; seven brothers, Lon­
nie Collier Jr. of Knox City, 
Jerry Lynn Collier of Fort 
Hood, Lawrence Edward 
Collier, Johnny Wayne

Weather
FURNISHED BY PLANT 
MATERIALS CENTER

4 Miles NW of Knox
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Collier, Timothy Ray 
Collier, Perry Lavon Collier, 
and Terry Lavett Collier, all 
of Munday; five sisters, 
Lynda Flye of Knox City, 
Carolyn Collier, Patricia 
Collier, Nicky Collier, and 
Hope Marie Collier, all of 
Munday; and her parents, 
Lonnie and Norma Collier of 
Munday.

Kevin was born December 
16,1974, in Knox City. In ad­
dition to the survivors listed.

Stenholm Asks 
Legislation To 
Balance Budget

Congressman Charles W. 
Stenholm has announced 
that he will introduce 
legislation to provide for a 
Constitutional amendment 
to balance the federal 
budget, except in times of 
war and national emergen­
cy. The newly elected 
congressman is of the firm 
conviction that this provision 
is necessary in order to 
maintain the fiscal integrity 
of this country.

Stenholm believes we 
should move away from the 
old Keynesian philosophy of 
“ tax and spend and spend 
some more.”  We have come 
to the point where we must 
pay our bills and not defer 
them to another generation 
who will pay the price of our 
folly.

Congressman Stenholm 
believes in a conservative 
spending policy and will vote 
against unnecessary federal 
programs.

he is survived by his father, 
Kenneth Ray Smith of 
Abilene.

Mekbra Nicole, born July 
28, 1976, in Seymour, is sur­
vived by her father, Julian 
Smith of Oklahoma City.

Help Is Sought 
For Fire Victims

Knox City and area 
residents who have ex­
pressed a desire to help the 
children of Nora Lee Taylor 
with needed clothing may 
contact Alestine Flye at 658- 
3464.

Alestine has the ages of the 
children and possibly 
suggested items and sizes.

Rumley Receives 
EMT Certificate

Glen Rumley, ad­
ministrator of the Knox 
County Hospital received 
notice this week that he has 
been fully certified as an 
E m e rg e n cy  M ed ica l 
Technician by the Texas 
State Department of Health.

Rumley was notified by 
mail along with receiving his 
official registration cer­
tificate and an official 
shoulder patch identifying 
him as an E.M.T. with a 
specialty in rescue and 
treatment of the sick and in­
jured in ambulance work.

A 13-week course of in­
struction was completed in 
December to be eligible for 
certification. He is a volun­
teer with the"khoX.Qty Area 
Ambulance service^=
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Highway 
Crews Due 
Much Credit

City officials have brought 
it to the attention of the News 
office that much credit is due 
the Texas Highway Depar­
tment for the manner in 
which the streets were kept 
during the prolonged sleet, 
snow, and ice situation.

The Highway Department 
maintenance crew bladed 
the ice and snow to the mid­
dle of the streets on Main 
and Central, leaving the 
traffic paths free of moisture 
for the most part. Then later, 
the ridge in the middle was 
bladed down and worked un­
til the moisture was gone.

The snow began on Friday 
night, December 29, and last 
Friday, January 19, was the 
first day that all of the snow 
and ice melted in yards and 
out-of-the-way places in the 
three week period. Then, 
sure enough without war­
ning, the snow began again 
Saturday morning; however 
this time temperatures were 
warm enough to melt the 
snow and sleet within a few 
hours.

The streets would have 
been impassable had the 
Highway crews not been on 
the job, and officials believe 
that residents should give 
the Texas Highway Depar­
tment much credit and 
praise for a job well done.

Rep. Heatly 
To Serve On 
Committees

AUSTIN - State Rep. Bill 
Heatly (D) of Paducah has 
been named as vice- 
chairman for appropriative 
matters of the Judicial Af­
fairs Committee and has 
also been appointed to a 
position on the Ap­
propriations Committee by 
House Speaker Bill Clayton.

Clayton said Rep. Heatly 
would serve in these 
capacities during the next 
two years of the 66th 
Legislature.

Rep. Heatly, an attorney 
by profession, is serving his 
13th te^m in the House. Last 
session, he served on the Ap­
propriations Committee.

The e le v e n -m e m b e r  
Judicial Affairs Committee 
has jurisdiction over all mat­
ters pertaining to civil law, 
civil procedure, uniform 
state laws, the State Bar of 
Texas, the Texas Judicial 
Council, and the State Com­
mission on Judicial Conduct. 
This standing committee 
also has jurisdiction over 
matters pertaining to 
private corporationsi the of­
fice of the Attorney General, 
requests to sue to the state, 
courts, and court 
procedures.

The twenty-one member 
Appropriations Committee 
has jurisdiction over all bills 
and resolutions ap­
propriating, allocating, or 
diverting funds from the 
state treasury. The Commit­
tee also has jurisdiction over 
all matters pertaining to 
claims and accounts filed 
with the legislature against 
the state, unless jurisdiction 
is granted to another stan­
ding committee.

Prize Monies Awarded 
At Livestock Program

A program, held here last 
Thursday night in the 
elementary gym in lieu of 
the annual Knox County 
Livestock Awards banquet, 
recognized buyers and con­
tributors to the premium 
sale which followed the an­
nual County Livestock Show 
on January 6.

This year’s sale, with a 
total of 34 animals, which 
was 13 less animals than in 
last year’s sale, brought in 
$9865.00, totaling $1700 more 
than last year’s $8102.84, ac­
cording to Leon Burkham, 
Knox C ity-O ’ Brien 
vocational ag teacher and 
FFA advisor.

Charles Lankford, general 
chairman for the program, 
presented certificates along 
with 8 X  10 pictures of the 
champion stock to the 
buyers. He also presented 
prize monies to the 
exhibitors with winning 
animals.

Burkham explained that 
officials were trying to get 
away from the banquet ex­
pense to families with par­
ticipating students and this 
year’s awards program with 
refreshments was held in 
hopes of having a larger tur­
nout.

Buyers, along with the 
names of the Knox City 
students whose animals took 
honors, include Pumpers 
Supply, James Albus, Cliff 
Swain, and Oliver Flying 
Service, all of Knox City, 
Kelley Boone; Rochester 
Tractor, Rochester Fer­
tilizer, and Bill Wilson Motor 
Co., Haskell, Jay Emerson; 
Lewis Paint and Body Shop, 
Knox City, and Munday 
Vegetable Growers, Mun­
day, Todd Lewis; Knox 
Prairie Seeds, Munday, Kyle 
White; Citizens State Bank 
of Knox City, David Counts; 
Farmers Grain, Knox City, 
Russell Hacker; Dr. R.G. 
Howell and Associates of 
Knox City and Petty Flying 
Service of Munday, Ranee 
Hacker; O’Brien Co-Op Gin, 
Kristi White; Lynn Electric 
and James Albus, both of

Knox City, and Petty Flying 
Service of Munday, Jeff 
Reece; B&C Chemical, Bob 
Burkham; Penman Oil Co. 
and Knox Feed Lot, Gaylynn 
Burkham; Knox County Fer­
tilizer and Dr. W.F. Thom­
pson and Associates, both of 
Knox City, David Flores; 
Doug and Shari Brown of 
Benjamin, Jay Rutherford; 
League Ranch, Benjamin, 
and Vernon Stockyards, Joe 
Godsey; Tri-State Chemical, 
O’Brien, Greg Oliver; M 
System Stores, Knox City 
and Munday, Karomy Sloan; 
and Knox Builders Supply, 
Knox City, and Knox City 
Grain, Steve Rutherford.

Buyers and contributors of 
Benjamin students’ animals 
include Farmers Grain, 
Knox City, and Wallace 
Moorhouse of Munday,

Doug Brown 
Has Reserve 
Champion

Doug Brown, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Stanton Brown, 
exhibited the Reserve 
Champion Angus steer at the 
recently completed Abilene 
Regional Livestock Show.

Dave Partridge showed 
the fourth place 
heavyweight Angus and the 
fourth place mediumweight 
Hereford. His sister, Julie, 
placed tenth with her 
heavyweight Cross steer. 
Dave and Julie are children 
of Mr. and Mrs. Wendell 
Partridge of Munday.

Shannon Ryder, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Ryder of Benjamin, showed 
the eleventh place medium- 
weight Cross steer.

Melissa Zeissel placed 
third in the lightweight 
crossbred steers. She is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Vernal Zeissel of Munday.

Six of the eight steers 
shown by these exhibitors 
qualified for the premium 
sale against some very 
strong competition.

Tammy Carver; Bill Ryder, 
Benjamin, Mark Oxford; 
Jerry Culwell, Dallas, Shari 
Brown; Patterson Ranch, 
Benjamin, SuLynn Oxford; 
Wes-Tex Coupon, Bobby 
Vasquez, and Citizens State 
Bank, all of Knox City, Doug 
Brown; Farmers Grain and 
Co-Op and Zeissel Brothers, 
both of Munday, Stasy Car­
ver; Bill and Donnie Ryder 
and Beavers-Mulky Ranch, 
both of Benjamin, Shannon 
Ryder.

Munday students and 
buyers of their animals in­
clude First National Bank of 
Munday, Melissa Zeissel; 
Andrade & Caram, Munday, 
Greg Walling; Quality Im­
plement and Parker Im­
plement, both of Munday, 
Julie Partridge; Beaty 
Grocery and Home Building 
Center, both of Munday, 
Randy Routon; Partridge 
Kids and Wallace 
Moorhouse, all of Munday, 
Greg Melton; Zeissel Fer­
tilizer and Seed, Jeff 
Decker; Rhineland Co-Op 
Gin, Angie Partridge; Knox 
Prairie Seeds Munday, Gary 
Birkenfeld; Abel Ag, Mun­
day, and Munday Tire & Ap­
pliance, Randy Waggoner; 
Christensen Aviation, Mun­
day and Knox City, and An­
drade & Caram, Munday, 
Larry Welch.

Mexican Dinner 
Scheduled Sunday

The Santa Rosa Men and 
Women’s Club is sponsoring 
a Mexican Dinner Sunday, 
January 28, in the St. Isabel 
Hall south of the Santa Rosa 
Catholic Church.

Serving will be from 11:30 
a.m. until 1:30 p.m.

According to a spokesman 
for the group, the menu will 
consist of cheese or meat en­
chiladas, rice and beans, 
salad, chips, hot sauce, 
dessert, and coffee or tea.

An ad elsewhere in this 
week’s News gives infor­
mation concerning prices for 
adult and children’s plates.

Seymour Aquifer Study Shows

Water Supply ‘Enough’

Did You Know...
that Bob Cameron, 3229 
Fargo, Fort Worth, Texas 
76113 subscribes to The Knox 
County News?

Officials of the Texas 
Department of Water 
Resources told residents of 
Knox and Haskell Counties 
that the water supply from 
the Seymour Aquifer is plen­
tiful and of good quality for 
irrigation.

Presenting a report on the 
water study was R.W. Har­
den of the contracting firm 
that preapred the two- 
volume examination. The 
study began in 1972 because 
of citizens’ concern over 
nitrate levels in water sup­
ply wells.

“ This study was the only 
one ever done in Texas that I 
know of that was planned 
under direct execution of 
both state and local levels,”  
Harden said.

Two groups, an agency 
advisory committee of state 
departments and a citizens 
advisory com mitt^df Knox, 
Haskell, and Ba^or county 
residents.

The three-county citizens 
committee includes chair­
man M.L. Wiggins, Clint 
Norman, and secretary 
Callie M. Combs, all of Mun­
day; Calvin Christian of 
Seymour; A.A. Cox of 
O’Brien; and Joe B. Cloud of 
Rule.

In addition to the water 
resources agency, other 
state agencies working on 
the project were Texas 
Department of Public Health 
and Texas Railroad Com­
mission.

Harden said, “ The area 
has a pretty darn good water 
quality for irrigation and the 
water situation looks good.

“ There’s no way we can 
dry up without pumping con­
siderably more than we have 
in the past,”  Harden said. 
“ There is a permanent long- 
range supply of water that 
pumpers can rely on up to 
the tune of about 50,000 acre 
feet a year,”  the hydrologist 
said.

Harden explained that 
about 50,000 acre feet of rain­
fall water seeps into the 
formation each year. The 
aquifer serves both domestic 
and irrigation water users in 
the three counties.

Some rural residents still 
receive drinking water from 
the aquifer, while Millers 
Creek Reservoir provides 
water to Knox City, Haskell, 
Munday, and Goree.

Robert Bluntzer of the 
water resources agency 
said, “ The study resulted in 
one of the best (water) 
products I’ve seen in a long 
time and I’ve been in the 
water business 16 years.”

Officials explained that 
most of the pollution to the 
aquifer occured in the first 
years of farming in the area 
that stirred up nitrates, and 
the pollution occured within 
the aquifer more than from 
man-made pollutants such 
as fertilizer and septic tanks
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Miscellaneous 
For Sale

ALL GIRLS’ blouses and 
dresses, size 2 through 14, V2 
price. Kids’ Duds, Haskell.

1-25 Itc
WE ALSO HAVE yard and 
garden fertilizer. See Her­
bert Bellinghausen or call 
658-3817. 3-30 tic

KNOX COUNTY HISTORY - 
Indexed, $15.60 plus $1.00 

'mailing. Available now at 
' Citizens State Bank in Knox 
City or write Knox County 
History, Truscott, Texas 
79260. 12-216tc

ALL FALL and winter mer- 
,chandise reduced to clear at 
, 1/2 price. Kids’ Duds, 
Haskell. 1-25 Itc

SEE YOUR MONUMENTS 
before you buy. More than 50 
designs to choose from. Also 

•̂*curb work. J.C. McGee.
10-21 tfc

MINNOWS, Bass, Crappie 
and Trotline Minnows, Stink 
Bait, Shrimp, Worms now 
available at The Country 
Store, .2 miles east of City 
Cafe, Mrs. L.D. (Irene) San­
derson. 12-14 tfc

WRANGLER CORDUROY 
pants, some suits, boys’ sizes 
2 through student, V2 price. 
Kids ’ Duds, Haskell. 1-25 Itc

FOR SALE - Baled Sudan 
Hay. Buy in field and save. 
David Counts, 658-3211 or 
658-3596. 10-12 tfc

WOODARD FARM SALES,
Haskell, Texas. Ford trac-

‘W; to</s, equipment, long
harrows, Lilliston, Hesston,
Oliver plow parts. 4-13 tfcvr

ALL BOYS’ and girls’ coats 
and sweaters, sizes infant 
through 14, Vz price. Kids’ 
Duds, Haskell. 1-25 Itc

COTTON S T R IP P E R  
Bearings and U Joints, Plow 
Discs, Krause Plow Parts, 
Service Shredder Parts, 
Bearings, Oil Filters, Belts, 
Delco Batteries for Tractors, 
Pickups and Cars, also Plugs 
and Points. EGENBACHER 
IMPLEMENT, INC. 11-30 tfc

FOR SALE - Fireplace 
wood, $45.00 a cord at farm. 
Lloyd Waldrip, 658-3137.

10-26 tfc

ALL WINTER sleepwear, 
boys and girls, Vz price. 
Kids’ Duds, Haskell. 1-25 Itc

HAY FOR SALE - Walter 
Rauch, 658-3440. 6-15 tfc

AUTO - State Farm insures 
more cars than any other 
company at deviated rates. 
LIFE - Generous dividends 
to all policy holders.
FIRE - Rates that currently 
average 25% less than Stan­
dard Texas Homeowners 
rates.
HEALTH - Provides a broad 
package of protection to help 
meet the rising cost of 
medical services.
FINANCE - Autos and boats 
at lower interest.

LEO FETSCH, AGENT 
Ph: Off.817/422-4259 

Hwy.267, Munday TX 76371

ALL BOYS’ Wranglers, Rob 
Roy, and Billy the Kid long 
sleeve shirts, Vz price. Kids’ 
Duds, Haskell. 1-25 Itc

ORGAN IN STORAGE - 1978 
Home Model Organ stored 

cr  locally. Reported like new. 
Responsible party can 
assume low balance. 
Automatic rhythm, walking 
boogie bass, single finger 
chords, banjo, etc. Call per­
son-to-person collect; Mr. 
R o b e r ts , 512-459-8660. 
National Keyboard, Inc., 
Austin, TX. 1-18 2tp

GOOD HAY for sale, $1.00 
per bale. Call 658-3771.

1-25 3tc

Give 
To The 
March 

Of Dimes

Miscellaneous 
Services

BAYLOR MILLING CO.
Throckmorton Highway, 
Seymour. Custom mixing - 
pelleting - your grain or 
ours. Range cubes, creep 
feeds, hog feeds, start to 
finish. 888-3921. 5-11 tfc

INSULATION: We have the 
finest. Contact Dennis Duke, 
phone (817) 454-3561 or 
Derrell Marion, phone (817) 
658-3249. 4-27 tfc

OSCAR’S TV SERVICE - 
Zenith Dealer, Zenith 
Chromacolor II and B/W, 8- 
track taped and auto tape 
decks. In-shop service. 
Phone 658-3647. 3-23 tfc

BUDDY TOLSON
WELDING SERVICE - Por­
table welding on farm and 
ranch. Will build pens and 
barns. Phone 454-3231, Ben­
jamin. 3-3 tfc
WATER WELL DRILLING -
Irrigation, stock wells, test 
holes, $7 ft. for house wells. 
W'.P. Hise, Haskell, Texas 
(8 r ) 864-3727, day or night.

Wanted

For Fast Results, Call (817) 658-3142 Today!

Real Estate

m
REALTOR®

WANTED - Someone to 
teach oil painting and tole 
painting in our store. Hap­
piness Is Homemade, Mun­
day, Texas, 422-4027. 1-25 Itc

WANTED TO BUY - Used 
Garden RotoTiller. Must be 
in good mechanical con­
dition. David Lorenz, 658- 
3349. 1-25 2tp

SALESMAN OPENING 
Salesman needed for large 
international chain of 
agricultural farm stores in 
fertilizer and pesticides. 
Good salary, vehicle, excep­
tional benefits. Knox City 
area.
Agricultural degree helpful 
or equivalent of selling ex­
perience.
Must have sales ability. Ex­
posure to product knowledge 
and agronomy helpful.
Send resume to Box Seven, 
Knox City, Texas 79529.
An equal opportunity em­
ployer. 1-25 3tc

RELIABLE HELP needed 
for work on metal building 
and some concrete work. 
Homer Rolston, (817) 454- 
3341. 12-21 tfc

HELP WANTED - CAREER 
OPPORTUNITY IN FOOD 
MANAGEMENT. Richeson 
Restaurants, Dairy Queen, 
need manager trainees to 
relocate. Excellent salary 
plus incentive bonuses put 
you- well up in the 5 digit 
salary category. Company 
insurance, free meals and 
paid vacation. Male or 
female. Mature adult. Need 
no experience in food. Learn 
in our training school. Must 
be willing to learn speed 
cooking as well as 
management. Phone (817) 
549-5041. Hours 9:00 to 4:00, 
weekdays. 1-4 4tc

WANTED - Used merchan- 'auAxdi 
dise. Lee Used Furniture,
Stamford, Texas, 773-5608.

4-20 tfc

RESIDENTIAL
LARGE 2-bedroom house, kitchen, living room, 1 bath, 
carport, rock fence, 3 pecan trees. You will not believe 
how nice this house is inside until you see it. 1107 South 
3rd.
SUPER BUY - Custom built 2 bedroom brick home - den, 2 
baths, living room, garage, homemaker’s dream kitchen. 
Located on 3 acres 4V2 miles from KC.
2400 SQ. FT. of country home on 5.6 acres. 4 bedrooms on 3 
levels, den with fireplace and great view. Basement 
playroom or 5th bedroom, utility room, kitchen with built- 
in oven and cooktop, dining room, 2 baths, wood shingles, 
2 car carport, 5 inch water well, horse lots and barn. Nice 
set up - ready now. This is the Rick Barnard home. Shown 
by appointment only by David Counts only.
IF YOU NEED lots of room, look at this; 5 bedroom, den, 
living room, kitchen, 2 baths, new paint inside and out, 
new roof, carpet, -nice lot. Reasonable price. 802 South 
Central.
EXCELLENT 3-acre tract. East edge of O’Brien on FM. 
2 bedroom, kitchen, dining room, 1 bath. Good buy. Hazel 
Clark place.

COMMERCIAL
BEAUTY SHOP building in Rochester. Would make a 
great lake cabin. Will sell to move or with lot. Good buy.
BOB’S SHOE SHOP in Haskell. Large main building, 2- 
bedroom house, 6 small buildings. Some rented at this 
time. Lots of sq. ft. 1V2 acres of land. $28,000. 
INVESTMENT REAL ESTATE - Texaco Service Station 
with 36,000 gallon storage. Good location. Priced to sell. 
FRAME BUILDING, formerly Hocus Pocus on East 
Main.
FOR SALE - Smith Liquid Gas property. Excellent 
location for your business.
FOR SALE - Feed store with office and large warehouse. 
Good business.
FOR SALE - Iron clad building on West Main.

FARM & RANCH
138 ACRES in northwest Haskell County. Some coastal 
grass, some pasture but mostly cultivated. Water 
available for irrigation. 3 stock water wells. Some 
working pens. Excellent hunting.

DAVID COUNTS 
Insurance and Real Estate 

102N. Ave. A.
(817) 658-3211

Automobiles 
For Sale

FOR SALE -1976 Pickup, 3/4 
ton, four-speed, long wheel 
base, clean. Alton Fit­
zgerald, 658-3865. 1-4 tfc

FOR SALE - 1975 Pontiac 
Grand Prix. See at Skiles 
Exxon or contact Weldon 
Skiles. 1-18 tfc

FOR SALE - Good condition, 
’72 Chevrolet Blazer. 210 
South Third Street, call 658- 
3303. 1-25 Itp

FOR SALE - 1975 Chevrolet 
Pickup; heavy duty 
package, mags, sidepipes, 
luggage rack, MORE ... 
REAL SPORTY ... Make me 
a deal - see Jimmy Rushing. 
12-28 tfc

1974 BUICK, lots of extras, 
one owner. David Counts.

1-4 tfc

THREE BEDROOM, two 
bath home, extra large 
living room, den and kit­
chen, new carpet, built-in 
dishwasher and stove, 
fireplace. Lots of storage, 
privacy fence, ap­
proximately 2700 square 
feet. Greg Clonts, 658-3340 or 
(512) 255-2615. 6-29 tfc

3-BEDROOM, U/2 bath, den 
with fireplace, carport, fen­
ced yard, corner lot. Good 
buy. 1100 S. 5th St. 
3-BEDROOM, 1 bath, fenced 
yard, storm cellar, corner 
lot, 1008 S. 4th.
FOR SALE - Large trailer 
house and 2 barns, 2 wells, 
lots other improvements, on 
approximately 1 acre, 4V2 
miles north Knox City.
IN NEED of listings, market 
very good. If you have 
something for sale, come see 
us.

arnold insurance 
and real estate 
phone 658-3509

Call In Your News 
658-3142

Legal
Notice

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
TO: EDGAR D. LEONARD, 
JOHN J. MERRILL, ROSE 
F. FITZGERALD AND 
DENNIS E. MAHONEY, 
Greeting:
You are commanded to ap­
pear by filing a written an­
swer to the plaintiff’ s 
petition at or before ten 
o’clock a.m. of the first 
Monday after the expiration 
of 42 days from the date of 
issuance of this Citation, the 
same being Monday the 26th 
day of February, A.D., 1979, 
at or before ten o’clock a.m., 
before the Honorable 
District Court of Knox Coun­
ty, at the Court House in 
Benjamin, Texas.
Said plaintiff’s petition was 
filed on the 18th day of 
December, 1978. The file 
number of said suit being 
No. 6601.
The names of the parties in 
said suit are: Robert E. 
Vanderpool as Plaintiff, and 
Edgar D. Leonard, John J. 
Merrill, Rose E. Fitzgerald 
and Dennis E. Mahoney, as 
Defendants.
The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to 
wit: A suit for the appoin­
tment of a receiver with 
power and authority to 

* execute, under order of the 
Court, an oil, gas and 
mineral lease or leases 
covering the outstanding 
mineral interests owned or 
claimed by Defendants upon 
such terms and conditions as 
may be prescribed by the 
court (including pooling 
provisions), in and under the 
following described land in 
Knox County, Texas:
Mineral estate in Section 54, 
Block B, A-690, H&TC Ry. 
Co. Survey, Knox County, 
Texas, containing 676.5 
acres, more or less.
If this Citation is not served 
within 90 days after the date 
of its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved.
Issued this the 11th day of 
January A.D., 1979.
Given under my hand and 
seal of said Court, at office in 
Benjamin, Texas, this the 
11th day of January A.D., 
1979.

/s / Gloria L. West, Clerk 
District Court, 

Knox County, Texas 
NO.6601

IN DISTRICT COURT, 
ROBERT E. VANDER­
POOL vs. Edgar D. Leonard, 
John J. Merrill, Rose E. Fit­
zgerald and Dennis E. 
Mahoney,
CITATIO N  BY
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PLUMBING - HEATING 
AIR-CONDITIONING

Jerry’s Plumbing
1658-3322 207 N. Central Knox City;

PI(ESCI(iPTI0]̂
SERVICE

PRESCRIPTIONS 
CONVALESCENT EQUIPMENT 

OTHER DRUG-RELATED ITEMS

Larson’s
Prescription Pharmacy

LAR8Y STAGGS RPh -Owner
658-3210 Res. 658-3223

Legal
Notice

NOTICE OF 
PUBLIC HEARING

The City of Benjamin, 
Texas, has filed Application 
No.384 with the Texas 
Department of Health for a 
permit to operate an existing 
Type III municipal solid 
waste disposal! site located 
south of the City of Ben­
jamin, 2V4 miles south of 
U.S. Highway 82 and Vz mile 
west of State Highway 283/6 
in Knox County, Texas. ‘

The site consists of ap­
proximately five acres of 
land, and is to daily receive 
approximately V\ ton of solid 
wastes under the regulatory 
jurisdiction of the Texas 
Department of Health when 
disposed of or otherwise 
processed in accordance 
with the said Department’s 
Municipal Solid Waste 
Management Regulations.

Pursuant to the provisions 
of the Texas Solid Waste 
Disposal Act (Article 4477-7, 
Vernon’s Texas Civil 
Statutes) and the Texas 
Department of Health 
Municipal Solid waste 
Management Regulations, 
and the Administrative 
Procedure and Texas 
Register Act, a public 
hearing on the aforesaid ap­
plication will be held at: 
Commissioners Courtroom, 
Courthouse, Haskell, Texas, 
at 9:30 a.m., Wednesday, 
February 21,1979, to receive 
evidence for and against the 
issuance of a permit for the 
aforesaid application. All 
parties having an interest in 
this matter shall have the 
right to appear at the 
hearing, present evidence 
and be represented by coun­
sel.

A copy of the complete ap­
plication may be reviewed at 
the Texas Department of 
Health, Austin, Texas, or at 
the Department’s Public 
Health Region 4 headquar­
ters located at Old (Cour­
thouse, Second Floor, 301 
Oak Street, Abilene, Texas.

Issued this 19th day of 
January, 1979.

Raymond T. Moore, M.D., 
Commissioner 

Texas Department 
of Health 

By: Edwin B. Fuller 
Hearings Examiner 
Texas Department 
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T’he Knox 
County News

P.O. Box 7
Knox City. Texas 70.529 
Telephone SI7

Billye B. Angle.........Publisher/Editor
Stacy Angle................ Assistant Editor
Published at Knox City. Texas 79529, 
every Thursday. Second Class Postage 
paid at Knox City, Texas 79529.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
One Year Subscription Within

50 miles of Knox Citŷ .̂............... $6
One Year Elsewhere in Texas.........$7
One Year Out of State.

With the proper clothing, a 
man can stand the extreme 
co ld  as lo w  as 50 degrees 
b e lo w  zero  F a h r e n h e i t .

I  I  Legal
I I Notice

NOTICE - Any erroneous reflection 
upon the character, standing, or 
reputation of any person, firm, or cor­
poration, which may appear in the 
columns of this paper will gladly be 
corrected upon notice of same being 
brought to the attention of the 
publisher.

Postmaster: Send change of 
address notices to The Knox 
County News, Box 7, Knox 
City, Texas 79529,

LEGAL INVITATION 
TO BID ON 

HIGHWAY MOWING

Sealed proposals for 
eleven separate highway 
mowing contracts in 
Childress, Dickens, Donley, 
Hardeman, Knox, and 
Wheeler Counties will be 
received at the State Depar­
tment of Highways and 
P u b lic  T ra n sp orta iton  
District Office in Childress 
at 1700 Avenue F, NW, P.O. 
Box 909, 79201, until 2:00 
p.m., February 7,1979.

Contracts will not be con­
solidated for bidding pur­
poses. Bidders must submit 
individual bids for any of the 
following separate highway 
mowing.contracts:

CONTRACT NO.l (1 
year): Donley County, U.S. 
Highway 287, from Ar­
mstrong County Line to 
Hedley, length 27.35 miles, 
approximate area 355.04 
acres.

CONTRACT NO.2 (1
year): Donley and Hall 
Counties, U.S. Highway 287, 
from Hedley to Estelline, 
length 26.25 miles, ap­
proximate area 339.04 acres.

CONTRACT NO.3 (1
year): Hall, Childress, and 
Hardeman Counties, U.S. 
Highway 287, from Estelline 
to F.M. 268, length 29.78 
miles, approximate area 
465.53 acres.

CONTRACT NO.4 (1
year): Hardeman County, 
U.S. Highway 287, from F.M. 
268 to Chillicothe, length 
29.55 miles, approximate 
area 480.12 acres.

CONTRACT NO.5 (2
years): Wheeler County, In­
terstate Highway 40, from 
Gray dk)unty Line to North 
Fork of Long Dry Creek, 
length UJO. milea,-„ap- 
proximate area 306.54 acres.

CONTRACT N0.6 (2
years): Wheeler County, In­
terstate Highway 40, from 
North Fork of Long Dry 
Creek to Station 1150-f 00 to 
include all of F.M. 3075, F.M. 
1547 (Wheeler Co.), F.M. 
2474, and F.M. 2168, length 
19.20 miles, approximate 
area 340.94 acres.

CONTRACT NO.7 (2
years): Wheeler County, In­
terstate Highway 40, from 
Station 1150-1-00 to Oklahoma 
State Line to include all of 
F.M. 1802 and Spur 30, length 
9.92 miles, approximate area 
314.29 acres.

CONTRACT NO.8 (2
years): Knox County, U.S. 
Highway 82, from King 
County Line to Baylor Coun­
ty Line, length 30.75 miles, 
approximate area 195.00 
acres.

CONTRACT N0.9 (2
years): Knox County, U.S. 
Highway 277, from Haskell 
County Line to Baylor Coun­
ty Line, length 13.27 miles, 
approximate area 112.00 
acres; and F.M. 266, from 
U.S. Highway 82 to Hefner, 
length 7.90 miles, ap­
proximate area 64.70 acres.

CONTRACT NO.10 (2

Legal
Notice

years): Dickens County, 
U.S. Highway 82, from 
Crosby County Line to F.M. 
265, length 17.82 miles, ap­
proximate area 328.81 acres.

CONTRACT NO.11 (2
years): Dickens County, 
U.S. Highway 82, from F.M. 
265 to King County Line to 
include all of F.M. 2941, 
length 18.16 miles, ap­
proximate area 331.28 acres.

Proposals, plans, and 
specifications may be ob­
tained at the Department of­
fice of the following main­
tenance construction super­
visors: A.B. Johnson Jr., 
Clarendon; Joe B. Hall, 
Shamrock; John W. Roth- 
well Jr., Childress; Gene R. 
Crabtree,Quanah; Huberts. 
Collins, Dickens; Terry L. 
Keener, Senior Resident 
Engineer, Munday; or 
District Office, Childress.

The State Department of 
Highways and Public Tran­
sportation, in accordance 
with the provisions of Title 
VI of the Civil Rights Act of 
1%4 (78 Stat. 252) and the 
Regulations of the U.S. 
Department of Transpor­
tation (15 C.F.R., Part 8), 
issued pursuant to such Act, 
hereby notifies all bidders 
that it will affirmatively in­
sure that the contract en-: 
tered into pursuant to this 
advertisement will be awar­
ded to the lowest responsible 
bidder without discrimina­
tion on the ground of race, 
color, or national origin.
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NOTICE
THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE OF 
T E X A S  C R I M I N A L  
TRESPASS (SENATE BILL 
111 PASSED BY THE 62nd 
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE, 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
ALL LANDS OF W.T. 
WAGGONER ESTATE ARE 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

KILLEN M. MOORE 
TRUSTEE

Card Of 
Thanks

No words can express the 
gratitude we feel to all the 
good people in Knox City for 
the kindness shown us 
during the loss of our loved 
one. We are so grateful for 
all the cards and the 
delicious food that was 
prepared and served to us. A 
special thanks to the women 
who were so sweet and kind 
to take their time to serve us 
and we pray God’s richest 
blessings on each and every 
one of you.

Clarence Strickland 
Algerene Logsdon & Family 

Darlene Howeth & Family 
Ralph Strickland & Family 

Nina Duncan & Family 
Curley Strickland & Family 

1-25 Itp

NOTICE
Unpaid City Taxes For 1978 

Become Delinquent 
AFTER

January 31,1979 
Avoid Penaity And interest By 

Paying Your Tax Before 
The Above Date

City of Knox City
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FORMER KNOX CITY RESIDENT Thomas Emmerson Robbins celebrated 
his 98th birthday, December 28, in the home of his daughter and her 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Sumpter Reed in Giadewater. On hand to help Mr. 
Robbins celebrate were his twin grandchildren, Jocelyn Williams of 
Midland, left, and Tom Reed of Lewisville. Mr. Robbins has made his home 
in Giadewater for the past eight years moving there from Knox City where 
prior to retirement he was a banker and farmer. Though his eyesight is 
failing, Mr. Robbins is in good heaith. (Giadewater Mirror Photo)

O’Brien Happenings
By CHARLENE BROTHERS

Have you ever seen so 
many different kinds of 
weaker in the same day? 
We never know just what is 
going to happen next. Right 
now it is nearly clear in the 
east and is snowing here at 
O’Brien, looks like it will not 
last long, at least I hope not.
I hope the farmers who have 
cotton in the field can get it 
out soon. You know this is 
getting to be old stuff, but 
seems that there is not much 
else happening.

I did find something new; I 
have been working on the W- 

.2 forms for the hands here at 
the gin, and have they been 
changed. If you make a 
mistake you just check a box ’ 
that has void by it and send 
that one in with the rest. I 
will have to watch myself 
very close or I may have as 
many voids to send in as 
good ones. They tell you 
what kind of type and ink to 
use. Everything is getting so 
complicated that it takes a 
college graduate to know 
how to do them, and then 
sometimes they have

M i

trouble. So, as you know I’m 
not a college graduate, it 
makes it extra hard on me.

The college students all 
got started back last week. 
The only ones from O’Brien 
that I know who are in 
college now are Keith Rowan 
going to Tarleton at 
Stephenville and Craig 
Brothers to Western Texas 
at Snyder. It seems we have 
come to a certain age of 
people, of which we do not 
have too many, who are 
college age. Most of them 
have gone somewhere else 
or are working around here 
and not going to school.

The City Council appointed 
an Equalization Board at 
their last meeting to serve 
for this year. They were
E. W. Hunt, Clifton Duncan, 
and Charlene Brothers, with
F. D. Emerson as alternate. 
This is another of the 
thankless jobs that have to 
be done around here. No one 
wants to serve on this board, 
as so many will not serve on 
a school board.

Food Winners To 
Compete Saturday

Two of the residents of our 
community who were in the 
hospital are home now doing 
pretty well. John Grindstaff 
Sr. and Grady Ellis both got 
to come home. A.A. Cox is in 
the hospital at Knox City, 
and has been pretty sick. At 
the time of this writing I 
have not heard any news, but 
suppose he is doing better. 
HERE AND THERE

Mr. and Mrs. David Hunt 
of Midland visited during the 
weekend with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. L.A. Covey, 
Greg, Ava and John Morgan 
and Mr. and Mrs. E.W. Hunt.

Mrs. Allen Moeller of 
Haskell visited in O’Brien 
Saturday with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Coy Hewitt and 
also saw the junior high 
basketball game in which 
her sister, Toni, was playing.

I’m sure there have been 
more visiting than this, but I 
have not heard it or found 
out about it. Nothing has 
been happening over here, 
except sometimes a farmer 
will come into the office and 
say, “ I would like to go to 
work,”  then when we offer 
them a job, they all of a sud­
den have something else to 
do.

Local’s Kin 
Buried In 
Paducah

Funeral services for Mrs. 
L.O. Mayberry of Paducah, 
grandmother of Mrs. Larry 
(Beth) Staggs of Knox City, 
were held Saturday after­
noon, January 13, at two 
o’clock in the First Baptist 
Church in Paducah with the 
Rev. Herman Lancaster of 
Seymour and Willie Rushing 
officiating. Special music 
was provided by Beth and 
Larry Staggs. Burial was in 
Garden of Memories 
Cemetery.

Mrs. Mayberry, 87, died 
Thursday, January 11, in 
Richards Memorial Hospital 
in Paducah.

Born January 25, 1891, in 
Sullivan County, Tennessee, 
to the late Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Shipley, she married Lan- 
ston Owen Mayberry on 
January 24, 1907, in
Seymour. Mrs. Mayberry 
died 13 days before their 
72nd wedding anniversary. 
The couple were residents of 
the'Seymour area for ap­
proximately 26 years where 
he carried mail from 
Seymour to Knox City. Mrs. 
Mayberry had resided in 
Paducah for more than 40 
years.

Survivors include her 
husband of Paducah; eight 
sons, J.O. of Slaton, Pete, 
Vernon, and T.J., all of 
Wichita Falls, W.P. of 
Paducah, J.A. and Horace 
Lee, both of Gallup, New 
Mexico, and Bobby J. of 
Odessa; five daughters, 
Mrs. Thelma Trammell of 
Paducah, Mrs. Gladys Jor­
dan of Seymour, Mrs. 
Maggie Harper of Post, Mrs. 
Helen Miller of Brunswick, 
Georgia, and Mrs. Maurice 
Truelock of Odessa; a sister, 
Mrs. Howard Bassitt of 
Hillsboro; 48 grandchildren, 
85 great-grandchildren, and 
19 g r e a t -g r e a t -
grandchildren.

Pallbearers were gran­
dsons including Billy 
Mayberry of Vernon, 
Thomas and Phillip 
Mayberry, both of Plain- 
view, Craig Mayberry of 
Paducah, Acie Ray 
Mayberry of Gallup, New 
Mexico, and Jim Bob 
Truelock of Odessa.

IN WALL HOME
Visiting with Mrs. Elmer 

Wall Jr. and Mr. and Mrs. 
H.E. Wall Sr. during the 
weekend were Rebecca An­
ne Wall of Albuquerque, New 
Mexico, and her friend, 
Susan Hayes.

They were enroute to 
Austin where they will be 
enrolled in school.

Six Knox County youths 
will match their foods and 
nutrition “ knowhow” again­
st that of youths from 
surrounding counties at the 
District 4-H Food Show, 
January 27, in Wichita Falls.

Competing in four classes 
for a senior division top 
place will be Robert Sutton 
of Knox City, bread and 
desserts; and Cindy Maston 
of Munday, snacks and 
beverages.

In the junior division will 
be Michael Rauch of Knox 
City, breads and desserts; 
Lori Griffith of Benjamin, 
side dish.

Also, Pam Welch of Mun­
day, main dish; and Lana 
Gideon of Benjamin, snacks 
and beverages.

All contestants earned the 
right to enter the district 
contest when they won top 
honors in county com ­

petition.

This year’s theme is 
“ Cooking Good - Looking 
Great.”

Receipe books of all the 
District Food Show con­
testants will be on sale at the 
District Food Show in Sikes 
Center. If readers would like 
one, they may' contact 
Sharon Book, Box 22, Ben­
jamin, Texas 79505 or call 
(817) 454-2651.

4-H food shows are spon­
sored by the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, the Texas A&M 
University System, and the 
Morrison Milling Company 
of Denton.

Educational program s 
conducted by the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice serve people of all ages 
regardless of socio-economic 
levels, race, color, sex, 
religion, or national origin.

Thinking of Going 
UNDERGROUND

For Your Next Home?

If So, Talk To

Dave Oxford
FREE ESTIMATES

(817)454-3641 BENJAMIN

Announcing...
the opening of

Haskell Chiropractic 
O ffice

J a n u a ry  2 2
One Ave. B

Two Blocks East of Square 
864-3950 Haskell, Texas S
Hours 8 a.m. til 5:30 p.m. Monday thru Friday 

8 a.m. til 12 Noon Saturday

Melvin H. Henexson

Protein
Needed

Knox City, Texas, Thursday, January 25,1979

Supplement 
For Cattle

While protein supplemen­
tation is one of the largest 
out-of-pocket expenses in a 
cow-calf operation, it is one 
of the most necessary sup­
plemental feed ingredients 
when other feed sources are 
low in protein.

Animals with low protein 
diets lose their appetite, 
develop a rough appearance, 
become! weak, and have 
lowered resistance to 
disease. The end result is 
reduced growth, reproduc­
tion and calf weights.

The need for protein sup­
plementation results as 
nutrient composition in 
forage changes with the 
seasons. Therefore, nutrient 
intake varies. Once grass 
stops growing and loses its 
green, lush appearance, it 
becomes coarse and fibrous. 
Crude protein content may 
fall from 12 to 4 percent or 
less, and forage dry matter 
digestibility may drop from 
65 to 35 percent. These 
nutrient compositions vary

Rowena Jacobs 
Artist Of Month

Artist of the Month at the 
Citizens State Bank is 
Rowena Jacobs of Haskell.

Rowena, who has been 
painting for about two years, 
studied under Mary Rike of 
Haskell, Ruth Adams of 
Abilene, Nell Bennett of 
Stamford, and Anita Herren 
of Haskell.

Rowena works for her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Melvin Jacobs, and they own 
and operate E lsie’s Hi- 
Lander Drive-In in Haskell.

She commented that pain­
ting was a real pleasure for 
her and hopes to encourage 
someone else to start pain­
ting.

greatly over time and supply 
cattle completely different 
diets due to seasonal 
changes.

Spring and summer diets 
are usually adequate for 
beef cattle needs while fall 
and winter diets are lacking 
in nutrient composition.

Cattle cannot eat enough 
poor quality forages to ob­
tain needed nutrients. Win­
ter grass is old and fibrous, 
low in nutrients, and more 
slowly digested. Thus, con­
sumption is lowered and the 
animal receives even less 
nutrients as a result of 
lowered intake.

Added protein increases 
digestion of fibrous 
material. It not only helps 
balance an animal’s protein 
needs but increases forage 
intake due to increased 
digestibility of the forage.

Since protein is required 
for growth and milk produc­
tion, protein requirements 
for heifers and lactating 
cows are higher than for dry, 
pregnant cows. Lactating 
cows require twice as much 
crude protein per day as dry, 
pregnant cows and 26 per­
cent more than heifers.

Ruminants such as cattle 
can synthesize much of their 
needed protein from low 
quality protein and NPN 
(non-protein nitrogen) sour­
ces such as urea and biuret 
when sufficient amounts of 
readily available car­
bohydrates are present in

Dr. C.L Cromwell
OPTOMETRIST

PHONE
(915)773-3542

STAMFORD

the rumen. Other sup­
plements include cottonseed 
meal, soybean meal and a 
wide variety of commercial 
dry and liquid supplements.

Protein supplements are 
available in many types and 
forms - cubes, cakes, liquids, 
self-limiting meal products 
and others, to allow different 
feeding methods. These will 
vary in nutrient com ­
position, and a producer 
should calculate protein cost 
in each. This cost figure and 
feeding and labor costs will 
help him select the most ef­
ficient supplement.

When balancing forage 
rations with supplemen­
tation, dry matter (energy), 
vitamins, minerals and 
protein are all considered. 
Most often, available protein 
is deficient, but sometimes 
energy is also lacking.

When energy is low, some 
grain may be fed along with 
protein to make up the dif­
ference in what is supplied 
from forage. A good low 
fiber, high protein range 
cube will probably be suf­
ficient.

Rocha Rites 
Held Friday

Requiem mass was said 
Friday afternoon, January 
19, at three o’clock in the 
Santa Rosa Catholic Church 
for Mrs. Cecilia Rocha with 
the Rev. Brendan McGuire, 
celebrant, officiating. Burial 
was in the Knox City 
Cemetery under the direc­
tion of Smith Funeral Home.

Mrs. Rocha, 86, died Thur­
sday, January 18, at 8:25 
a.m. in the Knox County 
Hospital following a brief 
illness.

Born May 10, 1893, she 
married Antonio Rocha in 
1934 in Big Spring. Mr. 
Rocha preceded his wife in 
death on December 31,1978, 
in Knox City.

Survivors include two 
brothers, Filomeno Franco 
and Juan Franco, both of Big 
Spring, and two sisters, Mrs. 
Raquel Lopez of San Antonio 
and Mrs. Rosa Pera of 
Presidio.

IN GRAHAM HOME 
Visiting in the home of Mr. 

and Mrs. Doyle Graham last 
week were her sisters and 
their husbands, Mr. and 
Mrs. Grady Simpson of 
Memphis, Texas, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Holcomb of 
Rochester.

When your 
water system 

lets you I 
down. . .  I

CALL

LYNN ELECTRIC 
MOTOR CO., INC. 

658-3511

I
I

YOUR JACUZZI DEALER!

CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDIT IO N
(Including Domestic Subsidiaries)

The Citizens State Bank
LEGAL TITLE OF BANK

CITY
Knox City

1326
STATE BANK NO.

Knox
COUNTY

FEDERAL RESERVE DISTRICT NO

Texas 2.9529
ZIP CODE

ASSETS

1. Cash and due from depository institutions
2. U.S. Treasury securities
3. Obligations of other U.S. Government agencies and corporations
4. Obligations of States and political subdivisions in the United States
5. All other securities
6. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell
7. a. Loans, Total (excluding unearned income)

b. Less: allowance for possible loan losses
c. Loans, Net

8. Lease financing receivables
9. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises

10. Real estate owned other than bank premises
11. All other assets
12. TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 11)
LIABILITIES
13. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations
14. Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations)
15. Deposits of United States Government
16. Deposits of States and political subdivisions in the United States
17. All other deposits
18. Certified and officers’ checks
19. Total Deposits (sum of items 13 thru 18)

a. Total demand deposits
b. Total time and savings deposits

20. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase
21. Interest-bearing demand notes (note balances) issued to the U.S. Treasury and 

other liabilities for borrowed money
22. Mortgage indebtedness and liability for capitalized leases
23. All other liabilities
24. TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) (sum of items 19 thru 23)
25. Subordinated notes and debentures 
EQUITY CAPITAL
26. Preferred s t o c k ...................................................a. No. shares outstanding
27. Common S t o c k ................................................... a. No. shares authorized

b. No. shares outstanding
28. Surplus
29. Undivided profits and reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves
30. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 26 thru 29)
31. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 24, 25 and 30)
MEMORANDA
1. Amounts outstanding as of report date

a. Standby letters of credit, total
b. Time certificates of deposit in denominations of $100,000 or more
c. Other time deposits in amounts of $100,000 or more

2. Average for 30 calendar days (or calendar month) ending with report date 
a. Total deposits (corresponds to item 19 above)

NOTE: This report must be signed by an authorized officer(s) and attested by not less than three directors other than the officer(s) signing the report.____________

l/We, the undersigned officer(s) do h e r ^  declare that this Report of Condition (including the supporting schedules) is true to the best of my knowledge and belief.

S IG N A TU R ^F OF^ICER(S)

NAME AND TITLE OF OFFICER(S) A U TH ^ZE D  TO SIGN REPORT

Bertha Rogers, Cashier

ORIZED TO SIGN REPORT

SIGNATUFtE OF DIRECTOR
n

AREA CODE/TELEPHONE NO.

(8 1 7 )  658-'35 27

DATE SIGNED

1 -2 2 -7 9
We, the undersigned directors, attest the correctness of this Report of 
Condition (including the supporting schedules) and declare that it has 
been examined by us and to the best of our knowledge and belief has been 
prepared in conformance with the instructions and is true and correct.

SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR

(MAKE MARK FOR
notary ’s se al)

State of ........ .................................................................................  County of ......... ?^710X.......
Sworn to and subscribed before me this..... 2 2 n d ....................day/vf ..... :J.3ffXlXECC.

and I hereby certify that I am not an qfpcer or director of this bank. ^
My commission expires ....... .^3:y....l.y..................... , 19 ... 79 .... ., Notary Public.
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KC School News

TH E KENNEL
JUNIOR CLASS NEWS 
By GerrI Watson

The Juniors that have been 
selected to the One-Act Play 
are Angelia Reid as Sadie 
Sheep; Tammie Helton as 
Horace T. Hare; Gerri Wat­
son as Wilfred M. Wolf; and 
Kelly Watson is one of the 
crew members. The first 
practice was held at Mrs. 
Watson’s house last Monday 
night. The contest which is 
held at Vernon will be on 
March 29. Good Luck!

The Juniors are still 
furiously working on their 
Junior kernes. They turned 
in their rough draft last 
Monday and then turned in 
their bibliography on Thur­
sday. Their outlines were 
turned in earlier and have 
been returned. The final 
theme is due on February 2.

BAND NEWS 
By Gerri Watson

The band is still playing 
different music to determine 
the final songs for contest. 
One that they have been 
working on is “ Spiritual” . It 
is a symphony which can be 
used. Three songs will be 
used at contest. There is also 
a possibility that “ Canto” 
will be used. The final contest 
date has been set for April 
24. The contest will be held at 
Vernon.

During the time before 
contest we will attend the 
Cisco Senior Festival at 
Cisco. We will also have two 
Pre-UIL clinics with Dr. 
Fry. He will be working with 
us and telling us what we are 
doing wrong and then help us 
do it right.

Everyone is reminded that 
they have to play off their 
second group of scales which 
are due by January 26.

SOPHOMORE CLASS 
NEWS
By Kim Whitley

Well, the first six weeks 
are finally over! Many 
people were lucky enough 
not to get a single failing 
slip. But some were not so 
fortunate. Even if they did or 
didn’t everyone is still trying 
to keep their head above 
water in some of our harder 
classes, which are Geometry 
and English.

School
Lunchroom

Menus
BREAKFAST MENUS 

January 29 - February 2,1979 
Monday: Peaches, cin-
nnamon toast, chocolate 
milk.
Tuesday: Orange wedges, 
muffins, chocolate milk. 
W ednesday: Scram bled 
eggs, buttered toast and 
jelly, chocolate milk. 
Thursday: Juice, peanut 
butter whip, buttered toast, 
chocolate milk.
Friday: Applesauce, cin­
namon roils, chocolate milk.

LUNCH MENUS 
January 29 - February 2,1979 
Monday: Pigs in blankets, 
pork and beans, scalloped 
potatoes, chilled pears, 
cookies, milk.
Tuesday: Burritos, Spanish 
rice, green beans, peach 
cobbler, milk.
Wednesday: Hamburger, 
lettuce, tomato and pickle 
slices, French fries, cake, 
milk.

Thursday: Chicken fried 
supreme, gravy, whipped 
potatoes, English peas, hot 
rolls and honey, milk.
Friday: Western burgers, 
ranch style beans, crisp dill 
pickles, apple crisp, milk.

School And 
Community 

Calendar

Thursday, January 25 - 
Eighth grade boys and girls 
vs. Weinert, here, 6:00 p.m.; 
Seventh and eighth grade 
girls and boys in Haskell 
Tournament.
Friday, January 26 - Knox 
City and Haskell basketball, 
here, 5:00 p.m.; Seventh and 
eighth grade teams in 
Haskell tourney.
Saturday, January 27 - All 
District Band Clinic/Con- 
cert; Seventh and eighth 
grade at Haskell tourney.

Tuesday, January 30 - Var­
sity basketball, Knox City 
and Aspermont, there, 5:00 
p.m.
Wednesday, January 31 - 
Noon Lions Club, Masonic 
Fellowship Hall.

Basketball
Results

VARSITY GIRLS

Paducah 713 815 =  43
Knox City 12 18 8 =  29 
Rhonda Skiles 6, Kay Howell 
6, Tammie Helton 5, Mindy 
Hutchinson 8, Gaylynn 
Burkham 2, Nina Alsides 2. 
Quanah 9 21 719 =  56
Knox City 01412 6 =  32 
Rhonda Skiles 10, Kay 
Howell 10, Tammie Helton 6, 
Gerri Watson 4, Brenda 
Albus 2.

JUNIOR VARSITY GIRLS 
Quanah 218 6 4 =  30
Knox City 511 X'4 16.;
Nonie Johnson 3, Kristi

White 4, Kelly Watson 2, 
Chayo Garcia 5, Joyce Her­
nandez 2.

O’Brien Tournament 
Eighth grade girls and boys 
won championship while the 
seventh grade boys won con­
solation.

EIGHTH GRADE GIRLS 
O’Brien 32 - Rochester 10
K. Boone 2, D. Helms 6, S. 
Roberson 8, D. Stafford 6, C. 
Albus 4, J. Grimsley 2, M. 
Castro 3, A. Quintana 1. 
O’Brien 38 - Weinert 14
K. Boone 2, S. Roberson 17, 
M. Garcia 5, T. Hewitt 2, J. 
Grimsley 2, A. Quintana 2, C. 
Albus 2.
O’Brien 26 - Munday 22
D. Helms 6, S. Roberson 18, 
J. Grimsley 2.

EIGHTH GRADE BOYS 
O’Brien 44 - Rochester 6
T. Meinzer 6, D. Guinn 4, J. 
Stafford 6, G. Watson 5, R. 
Guiterrez 4, M. Oliver 4, E. 
Ramos 2, J. Rocha 8.
O’Brien 40 - Weinert 9
T. Meinzer 4, D. Guinn 6, J. 
Stafford 6, R. Gutierrez 10, 
M. Oliver 8, E. Romas 2, A. 
Espinosa 2, J. Rocha 2. 
O’Brien 22 - Goree 17
T. Meinzer 10, R. Gutierrez 
6, J. Stafford 2, D. Guinn 4.

SEVENTH GRADE GIRLS 
O’Brien 7 - Goree 35
T. Garcia 5, N. Oudems 2. 
O’Brien 11-Patton Springs 20 
T. Garcia 4, N. Oudems 2, D. 
Holcomb 2, M. Bateman 1, T. 
Alsides 2.

SEVENTH GRADE BOYS 
O’Brien 44 - Goree 45
W.Hutchinson 8, K. Eaton 3, 
C. Whitley 4, D. Watkins 16, 
S. Rutherford 13.
O’Brien 25 - Munday 24
Hutchinson 2, Grindstaff 2, 
Whitley 2, Watkins 14, 
Rutherfords.
O’Brien 35 - Benjamin 25
Rutherford 9, Hutchinson 14, 
Whitley 4, Grindstaff 2.

Card of Thanks
We would like to express our sincere and 

humble thanks to our friends for their many acts 
of kindness during John L .’s hospital stay.

The flowers, cards, your prayers and concern 
meant so much and are deeply appreciated. Our 
special thanks go to Dr. Thompson and the nur­
sing staff for their excellent care.

Mr. and Mrs. John L. Grindstaff Sr.
and Family

DANCE
to the

ROADRUNNERS 
With Roland Smith

(A GOOD ENTERTAINER)

Rhineland Gym
(BEST FLOOR, BEST SOUND)

Sat. Night, Jan. 27
9 t o 1

THE HAYLOFT
(Form erly  W inona's o f H askell)

invites you to come by and 
get acquainted with the new owner, 

BETTYE McBROOM.

Clearance Sale In Progress
1/3 off group

Wranglers, Levi’s, Faded Glory, Center Stage 

1/2 off group

Ladles’ Blouses, Teen Blouses, Scarves and Jewelry

STREAMS IN 
DESERT PLACES
By OZELLE STEPHENS

“ Yes, ask anything, using 
my name, and I will do it.” 
(John 14:14)

Jesus is saying to you and 
whosoever will believe in 
Him, “ In solemn truth I tell 
you, anyone believing in me 
shall do the same miracles I 
have done, and even greater 
ones, because I am going to 
be with the Father, and you 
can ask him anything, using 
my name, and I will do it, for 
this will bring praise to my 
Father because of what I, 
the Son, will do for you.” 
(John 14:12-13-)

These are some of the last 
words Jesus said to His 
believers. He said, “ I don’t 
have much time to talk to 
you, for the evil prince of this 
world approaches. He has no 
power over me, but I freely 
do what the Father requires 
of me so that the world will 
know that I love the Father.”  
V.30.

Every Christian is being 
approached in these last 
days, by the evil prince of 
this world, but if you are a 
true believer, you can say 
with Jesus, “ He has no 
power over me.” Because 
Jesus said, “ I will not aban­
don you or leave you as or­
phans in the storm, I will 
come to you.”

He also said, “ I am 
leaving you with a gift - 
Peace of mind and heart. 
And the peace I give isn’t 
fragile, like the peace of the 
world gives. So don’t be 
troubled or afraid.” V.27.

KC Colored News-Events
CHILDREN TRAVELING  
ALONE CAN BE SAFE

St. Paul had a large atten­
dance for Sunday school, 
Supt. in charge. The lesson 
well taught by the teacher 
and reviewed by the pastor. 
For morning service, the 
pastor preacheti from 
Philippians 3: 13-15. sermon 
“ Let us press on”

In the afternoon some of 
St. Paul were in Seymour for 
the third Sunday musical.

On Monday afternoon the 
Bible study class were held 
at First Baptist sponsored by 
Mrs. E. Hob (Lois) Smith, 
present were Mrs. Martha 
Crothers, Alestine Flye, 
Beatrice Mays. Everyone is 
welcome to come and be 
with us. The next meeting 
will be Wednesday, January 
31, at 3:00 p.m. please come. 
Mrs. Lois Smith teacher.

Monday evening the St. 
Paul ladies held their 
mission a very spiritful 
lesson were taught by the 
teacher Mrs. Martha 
Crothers,

This reporter is very sad 
at this time, Nora Lee Taylor 
and two children lost their 
lives when their house burn 
Tuesday morning.

SERVICES OF THE 
CHURCH OF GOD 

IN CHRIST

Sunshine Band was held on 
S atu rd ay  e v e n in g . 
Missionary Wilson taught 
the lesson from Psalms 78.

Sunday school had a good 
attendance with Supt. Smith 
in charge. In the morning 
service Sis. Manuel taught a 
good lesson from Hebrews 
11.

The YPWW Joint meeting 
was held at the (Joree church 
Sunday evening with 
Missionary Ella Johnson of 
Stamford and Minister 
James Washington from the 
Rule Church bringing the 
messages. Missionary John­
son taught from Psalms 37 a 
few verses and Hebrews 4 
concerning the Rest to the 
People of (]k)d, and Minister 
James Washington preached 
fromPs. 121.

The weekly meetings are 
being held here. Prayer 
meeting is held at the Knox 
City Church of God in Christ 
Monday through Friday at 5 
p.m. Everyone is welcome to 
come to the church and pray.

Prayer mepting is Olso 
held Monday, Wednesday, 
and Saturday at 9 a.m. These 
prayer meetings are held in 
different homes. Anyone 
desiring prayer to be held at 
their home contact 
Missionary Nettie M. Ward, 
Knox City.

We greatly regret the 
death of Mrs. Nora Lee 
Taylor and two of her 
children that were burned to 
death Tuesday morning. Let 
us pray and do what we can 
to help this family.

More children are traveling 
alone than ever before. And 
most transportation com­
panies have procedures to 
ensure their safe transit. With 
the holiday season upon us 
American Express offers tips 
about travel plans for an 
unaccompanied child.

• Children under fivê  are 
not allowed to travel alone in 
planes, buses or on most rail­
roads. Solo children traveling 
by Amtrak must be at least 
eight years old.

• Children traveling alone 
must pay full airfare. In the 
U.S. they will only be ac­
cepted for direct flights. In­
ternationally, they will be 
escorted to connecting flights

by airline p ^ on nel.
• The parent or guardian 

who brings the child to the 
airport must fill out a form 
giving the name, addre'ss and 
telephone number o f the 
person the child will meet at 
his destination with the help 
of an airline representative.

• Amtrak insists that an 
unaccompanied child be in­
terv iewed by the station- 
master before special forms 
are completed.

• Bus lines have no formal 
procedures, but they advise 
that children be introduced 
to the driver and seated near 
him during the trip.

B REDUCING THE COST 
OF HEALTH CARE

ATTEND MARKET
Mrs. Dessie Egenbacher 

and Mrs. Rolanda Orr retur­
ned Monday night from 
Dallas where they attended 
summer market at the Ap­
parel Mart.

Mrs. Egenbacher was 
buying merchandise for The 
Lady Bug Shoppe.

You have it in your power to hold down health care | 
I costs. Personal living hahits have a profound effect on 

your health. If you ate properly, got adequate rest and 
exercised regularly, there would not be such a great I 
need for health technology.

It is less expensi' e.to modify your behavior and 
I remain healthy than to return j ou to health after the 
damage has been done. It’s not easy but in the long run i 
you come out ahead. Start off the New Year by 
resolving to take better care of your body.

! YO U  OR YOUR DOCTOR CAN PHONE US 
when you need a delivery. W e will deliver 
promptly without extra charge. A  great many 
people rely on us for their health needs. W e  
welcome requests for delivery service and charge 
accounts.

RX DELIVERIES AVAILABLE IN KNQX CITY

H-M Jones 
Pharmacy, Inc.

Knox City, Texas Phone 658-3215

B..D B a  B 5  R D R H  R u H  R 5  R 0 R

SHOP UNO S H E  
ST SLLSUP’S

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
JANUARY 2 5 -2 7 .1 9 7 9

JANUARY INVENTORY
REDUCTION

HUNT'S HAL/SLIC.

15 OZ. 
CANS 83«

HUNT’S HAL/SLIC.

PEACHES
16 OZ. 
CANS 83«

HUMT’S

1 KETCHUP

83«32 OZ. 
BTL.

SHORTEHIHfi

NOW
RIFT

2

HUNT’S WHULE

TOMATOES

lOViOZ.
CMS

BORDERS

BUTTERMILK QT
I I  f l  f i  borders49 FROSTY POPS

$ 4  I Q  BORDER'S

cThI yogurt 2 0 0
CTHS. w  V

HRHT’S FRUIT

COCKTAIL

2 83^

HURT’S WHOLE HEW

OTATOES

!4V2 OZ. 
CANS 83^

HUNT’S STEWED

iTOMATOES 2 14V2 OZ. O  O  6  
CARS

m m

HUNT’S TOMATO

JUICE
46 OZ. 
CAN 63<^
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Benjamin News

FROM LUBBOCK 
Visiting in the home of the 

Allen McGaugheys over the 
weekend were their 
daughter, Sarah, and her 
dormmate, Becky Hendrick, 
both students at Texas Tech 
University in Lubbock.

By GLADENE GREEN

BASKETBALL NEWS
Since the Christmas and 

New Year’s holidays, 
basketball has really been in 
full swing. Several games 
were played the past couple 
of weeks. The Weinert score 
was Benjamin 62 - Weinert 
28. Boys’ game scoring was 
Craig Hertel 22, Joey Pierce
12, Mark Oxford 10, Louis 
Baty 5, Jimmy Redwine and 
Billy Carl Benson 4 each, 
and John Mark Kinnibrough 
and Gregg Collins, 2 each.

Girls game - Benjamin 46 - 
Weinert 31. Tammy Carver
13, Rhonda Herd 12, Stasy 
Carver 11, Lynda Brooke 
Hudson 4, Becky Welch, 
Sheila Benson and Shannon 
Ryder, 2 each.

Paint Creed 36- Benjamin 
36; Joey Pierce 14, Craig 
Hertel 12, Billy Carl Benson 
10, Michael Golden, Gregg 
Collins 4 each, Jimmy Red- 
wine 5 each, Louis Baty 8, 
Tracy Cartwright, John 
Mark Kinnibrugh and Pedro 
Estrada 2 each.

Girls -  Benjamin 52 - Paint 
Creek 32. Rhonda Herd 23, 
Tammy Carver 14, Becky 
Welch 6, Lynda B. Hudson 4, 
Shannon Ryder 2, Debbie 
Lindsey 2, and Stasy Carver 
1.

Girls - Benjamin 46 - Goree 
50; Rhonda 22, Tammy 7, 
Lynda B. 6, Shannon, Stasy, 
Michelle Bufkin and Becky 
Welch, 2 each; and Sheila 
Benson 1.

Girls - Benjamin 47 - 
Rochester 29. Rhonda 20, 
Stasy 15, Tammy 5, Michelle 
Bufkin 6, Sheila Benson 1.

Sorry, I don’t have the 
boys scores in the Goree and 
Rochester games. Might all 
also in the Rochester game, 
Benjamin only had six girls 
to play as the rest of the girls 
were sick. So I think that is 
quite an accomplishment to 
win with such few girls. Girls 
sometimes get into foul 
trouble but with so few guess 
they knew they’d better do 
their best!!
H ERE ‘N TH ERE

Visiting Mrs. O.D. Propps 
and Julia recently were Mr. 
and Mrs. Lonny Morgan of 
Las Alomos, New Mexico, 
Buddy Stephens and Jim 
Hanna, Dallas, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Danny Allen, Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Ricky Stam­
ps, Becky and Cody were 
Wichita Falls visitors 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Van Green 
spent the weekend with 
Jackie and Diane Daniel in 
Graham,

EHEClub 
Hears KC 
Teacher

The Extension Home 
Economic Club met Monday 
night in the Community Cen­
ter with seven members and 
the HD agent, Sharon Book, 
present.

Officers for the coming 
year were elected and in­
clude president, Melonie 
Dillon; vice president, Susan 
E m e rs o n ; s e c r e ta r y -  
reporter, Sherry Hacker; 
and treasurer, Sandra 
Chambers.

The program on “ Lan­
dscape Planning’ ’ was 
presented by Jim Dillon, 
horticulture teacher in Knox 
City High School. He brought 
with him a very interesting 
potted house plant, known as 
grape ivy, which was given 
as a prize and won by Sherry 
Hacker.

The door prize was won by 
Sharon Newton and fur­
nished by Carolyn Sloan.

Refreshments, furnished 
by Pearl Eaton and Sherry 
Hacker, were served to San­
dra Chambers, Carolyn 
Sloan, Kay Rogers, Susan 
Emerson, Melonie Dillon, 
Sharon Newton, Sherry 
Hacker, and the HD agent.

The next meeting will be 
held on February 26.

TOURING THE KNOX CITY Horticulture 
Greenhouse Friday of last week with KC in* 
structor Jim Dilion, ieft, were Benjamin vo-ag 
students Joey Pierce, middie, and Jim Red- 
wine. Students are shown here viewing the hor- 
ticuiture pre-empioyment iab. (Benjamin Schooi 
Photo)

Hudson Dies 
Monday In 
Phoenix

Funeral services for for­
mer Benjamin resident 
Robert M. Hudson Sr. of 
Tucson, Arizona, were pen­
ding as of Tuesday afternoon 
with Smith Funeral Home in 
Knox City. Rosary was said 
in the Whitney and Murphy 
Funeral Home Chapel in 
P h oen ix  W edn esday  
evening, January 24, at 
seven o’clock. Mr. Hudson, 
69, died Monday, January 22, 
in a Phoenix hospital 
following a lengthy illness.

Born January 22, 1910, he 
was a retired salesman and 
a member of the Catholic 
Church.

Survivors include his wife, 
Lupita of Phoenix; two sons, 
Robert Jr. and Thomas, both 
of Phoenix; four daughters, 
LuWanna Phillips of 
Phoenix, Belle Johnson of 
Tucson, Amelia Firpo of 
Phoenix, and Dianna Maki of 
Walker, Arizona; a brother, 
G.H. Hudson of Benjamin; 
and a sister, Mrs. Luella 
Tolson, also of Benjamin.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Lindsey 
and girls visited her parents 
in Aspermont Sunday.

Rachel Pittilo and Micky 
of Olton visited the Ricky 
Stamps over the weekend.

Alex Hale of Midland is 
spending this week with his 
father. Buddy Hale.

Visiting the Bobby Rober­
sons Friday and Saturday 
were Catherine Wharton and 
Jackie Hance of Lubbock, 
Willa Lois Timberlake of 
Levelland and Glen Feem- 
sterof Vera.

Mr. and Mrs. Dutch Young 
visited their daughter. Dee 
Ann Young and Brenda and 
David Gallagher in Wichita 
Falls Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Freddie 
McGregor and Kris of 
Wichita Falls visited her 
parents, the Kenneth Rober­
ts, during the weekend. 
BENJAMIN FFA NEWS 
By Billy Benson

The Benjamin Chapter 
went to Knox City Friday, 
January 19, to tour the Knox 
City Vo Ag Greenhouse. Jim 
Dillon led us through the 
greenhouse and told us a lot 
about it. The place was not 
just a building covered with 
fiberglass with plants in it. It 
was much more. It had three 
separate rooms each 20’ x 40’ 
with a 8’ X 10’ store room on 
the west side. The

greenhouse had a heating 
and cooling unit for each 
room. Mr. Dillon pointed out 
that without the cooling 
system it would get up to 50 
degrees hotter in the 
greenhouse rooms than the 
outside temperature in the 
summer. He also discussed 
the watering and fertilizing 
system.

A sterile soil mixture is 
made with a cement mixer. 
The soil was a mixture of 
peat moss, vermiculite and 
ready earth.

Outside the greenhouse, 
Mr. Dillon showed us the lath 
house, cold frames, and the 
orchard. Each tree in the or­
chard was watered with a 
low pressure emitter that is 
underground.

The greenhouse was very 
interesting and we thank Mr. 
Dillon for giving us such a 
good tour.

Look
Who’s
Here

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Bob 
Shaw of Abilene are the 
proud parents of a baby 
daughter born Tuesday, 
January 16, at Haskell 
Memorial Hospital.

The young miss has been 
named Shawna Marie and 
she weighed seven pounds, 
eight ounces. She measured 
21% inches in length.

Helping welcome the baby 
home was big sister, 
Druann, who is two years 
old.

Maternal grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. L.G. 
Vassar Jr. of Knox City, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Shaw of 
Haskell are paternal gran­
dparents.

Church School ■* 10:00
Morning Worship 11:00
Evening Worship 6:00

James P. Patterson, Pastor

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
406 S. Second Knox City, Texas

You can save money on electricity 
costs...lf your home has an 

Energy Efficiency Award from WTU
Before you buy or build that all-electric dream house you've 

been planning all these years, make sure it incorporates  
energy-saving ideas to help you keep your electricity bills in line. In 
these days of rising power costs, whether or not a house will help 
you use energy wisely is a factor you should consider just as carefully 
as you do size, location and architectural style.

That's why you need to know about the Energy Efficiency 
Award program sponsored by West Texas Utilities Company. An 
all-electric home that merits this award has been designed and built 
to help you make the most of every dollar you spend for electricity; 
it is well insulated, weather-stripped and equipped with efficient 
electric heating and cooling systems. A qualified technician from 
WTU checks the house for these and other important features that 
boost its energy efficiency.

When you live in a home that has earned the Energy Efficiency 
Award -  and follow WTU's suggestions for using energy wisely -  
you can be sure that you're getting the full value for every kilo­
watt-hour you buy.

Pick up your FREE booklet at any WTU local office. Trained 
W TU representatives are available to advise you on proper energy 
management. Call W TU and arrangements will be made for a repre­
sentative to assist you, free of charge.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

NATIONAL
ENERGY

fATCH

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Jordan 
of Canton are the parents of 
a daughter, Jami ,Kaylynn, 
born January 9, at 4:46 a.m. 
in Mother Frances Hospital 
in Tyler. She weighed six 
pounds, four and one-half 
ounces, and measured 2OV2 
inches long. The baby has 
one sister, Reesa.

Maternal grandparents 
are Mrs. Charles Reese of 
Knox City and the late Mr. 
Reese, and Mr. and Mrs. 
V.H. Jordan of Wills Point 
are paternal grandparents.

Great-grandparents in­
clude Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Jordan and Mrs. Lemar 
Burns, all of Canton, and Mr. 
and Mrs. D.W. Mitchell of 
Mineral Wells.

Make-Up Game 
Set For Saturday

A make-up basketball 
game with Aspermont will 
be played in Knox City 
Saturday, January 27, in the 
high school gym.

Due to a forced can­
cellation from the recent ice 
storm, the rescheduled 
games will begin at 5:00 p.m. 
with the junior varsity girls 
followed by the varsity girls 
and boys teams.

Council
Presented
Program

the Knox County Home 
Demonstration Council met 
Wednesday, January 17, in 
Benjamin with Sue Oxford, 
president, calling the 
meeting to order. Opening 
exercises were given by 
Pearl Ryder.

A very educational leader 
training program on aerobic 
and isometric exercises was 
presented by Sharon Book, 
assistant county agent, and 
Curly Hayes, aided by 
Tammy Carver.

The standing rules for the 
Knox County Council were 
discussed. Members voted to 
change the organization’s 
name to Knox County Exten- 
s ion  H om em ak ers 
Association. All other rules 
were readopted as stated. It 
was also discussed and voted 
on to help the 4-H club with 
the food club and dress 
review.

Knox City, Texas, Thursday, January 25,1979

Painting - Repairing - Rebuiiding 
Windshieids - Seat Covers - Door Glass
FRAME STRAIGHTENING < WHEEL ALIGNING

24-Hour Wrecker Service

Lewis Paint & Body Shop
Sterling Lewis, Owner 
Knox City, Texas

Telephone 658-3342 
Nights Dial 658-3330

Sherry Speck 
On Merit List

SNYDER - Sherry Speck 
of Knox City has been named 
to the Merit List for the 1978 
fall semester at Western 
Texas College.

To qualify for the Merit 
List, students must have a 
grade point average of 3.5 or 
above while enrolled for at 
least eight but fewer than 12 
hours of college credit work.

Call In Your News 
658-3142

Boyd’s 
Welding 
Service

Backhoe Service 
Available 

24 HR. SERVICE

Shelton Boyd 
(817)658-3639

AVIATION, INC. 
“ Providing A Service”

HELICOPTER - FIXED WING 
J.M. [Chris] Christensen R. Gary Morris
M unday Airport 422-4536 Knox City Airport 658-3716

Whatever happens 
well make it 

together.
T h is  y e a r ’s a  r e a l p u zzler. A n 5rth in g  co u ld  h a p p en . B u t n o  m a tte r  

w h a t, y o u  ca n  co u n t o n  u s to  h a n g  in  th e re  w ith  y o u . J u st lik e  w e  
h a v e  fo r  51 y e a rs .

A n d  w h e n  y o u  sa v e  w ith  u s  y o u ’ll  e a rn  th e  h ig h e s t  ra te s  a llo w e d  
b y  law .

You Deposit 
This Lump Sum 
(Minimum)

$  5

$ 1,000
$ 1,000
$ 1,000
$ 1,000
$ 1,000
$ 1,000
Money
Market
$10,000

For
This
Long

Osamatic
Prestige
Account

Compounded 
Daily At 
This Rate

Your 
Actual 
Yield Is

6mos.
l y r .

SOmos.
4yrs.
6yrs.
8yrs.
Omos.

5V4% 5 . 3 9 %  

5 % %  5 . 9 2 %

6 % %  6 . 7 2 %

6 % %  6 . 9 8 %

7 ^ %  7 . 7 9 %

7 % %  a 0 6 %  

8 %  A 3 3 %

\hriable
Call us collect for 
the weekly rate.

For quotes on deposits over $100,000, just give us a call.
Early withdrawal on savings certificates is subject to reduction to passbook rate 
plus 90 days interest penalty.

OLNEY
SAVINGS

Olney, Seymour, jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocona and now Weatherford and Azle.

Tb us, people are worth a lot more than money.

F S O C
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INSTANT

TEA
3-OZ. 
JAR

SUNSHINE

Vanilla Wafers

r  BAM A1

PAM
SPRAY C0ATIN6

GRAPE
JELLY

2-Lb. Jar

t N

OUR DARUNG CREAM STYU 
or WHOLE KRRNIL

CORN
No. 303 3/St.oo
ClwIMa
FLOUR
$3.49 25

Lb.

Star Kist

7 oz. can

S ta r -K is t

DEL MONTE 
SLICED

BEETS

Cons
beets

Monte

CARROTS

W-'it

A

GLADIOLA
POUCH 
MIXES

6 0z.

immmmmi

meats
V

Semi-Boneless

PORK ROAST *1*’
GROUND BEEF-

COOCN'S CERMAN ^  ^  ^  a

SAUSAGE *1
FR ESH FR O ZEN  S ib. box d » O O e

Chicken L e g s .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . -  * 3
HORMEUITTLE R i  A O

SIZZLERS..............“■.............$ |0 ’
W IL S O N ’S ■

FRANKS 3 9 ^
120Z. ...................................... ..............................................

N

isPEciALj Sunrise Canned Sodas $Q99
Orange or Root Beer

11

Admiration
COFFEE

IB.CAN AO /9
filRlIUVR GHINO

Mmiratioo
coffee

12 Oz. Can 
6 PAC

WITH EACH FILLED Buccaneer
DISCOUNT aOOKLST

PINTO

B E A N S
4 Lbs.

WITH EACH filled Biiccineer
DISCOUNT BOOKLET

DETERGENT
TIDE

GIANT 
SIZE

OLEG
WHITE SWAN

19«
WITH EACH FILLED nuccaneer 

Dis c o u n t b o o k let

GLADIOLA

F L O U R
5 Lb.

A TM fACH Filled Buccaneer
Disc o un t bo o k let

DEL MONTE

BANANAS

RED
DELICIOUS

APPLES
4 Lbs.

Lb.

160ZJ
CANS

Welch Grape Juice 24 Oz.

ITANJOU

PEARS
WHITE

m m s

n R R R S J K IjM M

TONV'S c h o ic e

iW ffS M M M W -

PIZZA

4 Oz. Btl.

ALL KINDS *̂ 1

Crinkis Cut

POTATOES

2-Lb.
Pkgs,

Health & Beauty Aids

o n  o f 
Ofay
SHORT&
SASSY
SHAMPOO

BATHROOM
TISSUE

CORONET

LB. 3 Lbs. for $100

Golden
Delicious

A p p le s
4 9 <^

CALIFORNIA

CARROTS
Lb.

4-Roll



News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home

=M:

By EDNA EUBANK

r

B a k e r  A d d r e s s e s  
S tu d y  C lu b  M e m b e r s

Mrs. Ruth Harden informs 
this writer that she has been 
conducting Sunday School 
classes in lieu of Ozelle 
Stephens. Sorry, I didn’t 
know about this. We thank 
Ruth for helping.

Mrs. Clark and Waynell 
had Ramona Helms and Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Clark of 
Megargel as their guests.

The Foursquare Church 
held services last Sunday. 
We want to thank these 
church members for getting 
out on such a bad day to 
make life a bit better for our 
older people.

Mr. and Mrs. Rufus 
Burleson of Stamford called 
on Jim Burleson and the 
Dabneys.

Mrs. Williamson enjoyed 
having Blanche Elliott and 
Clifford Williamson.

Mrs. Gladys Cartwright 
and her son W.T., both of 
Benjamin, and Mrs. Lois 
Golden were guests of Mrs. 
Cora Gillentine.

Ruth Henderson was 
pleased to see her daughter 
Mrs. Morrow of Monday.

Fay Lunday visited her 
sister, Georgia Keck.

Mrs. Nena Alvis is a new 
resident of the home. She 
comes from Rochester. 
Welcome, Mrs. Alvis.

Eldora Gray and Grace 
Posey were visitors in the 
home. Some of those visited 
were Mrs. Posey, Mrs. 
Chandler, Mrs. Bearing and 
others.

Mr. Benson enjoyed visits 
from his wife, Kenneth Ben­
son and Wanda, Joyce Jen­
nings of Wichita Falls, 
Tommie Benson and his son 
Charlie of Clyde.

Our birthday party was 
very successful. The old 
folks enjoyed cake, punch 
and singing afterward, the 
ladies of the O’Brien Baptist 
Church accompanied by 
their pastor. Bill Trice and 
his wife. The food was 
superb and the cake with 
“ Happy Birthday’ ’ was 
beautiful. Thanks, folks, for 
such an enjoyable evening. 
We appreciate your interest.

Mrs. Pray welcomed Mar­
jorie Baker, Mrs. L.M. 
Williams, and Betty 
Williams.

Mrs. Chandler enjoyed the 
B.E. Smiths of Munday.

Mrs. Snelson, Bonnie 
Tankersley and Dorothy An-

Stenholm 
Assigned To 
Committee

WASHINGTON,- D.C. - 
Congressman Charles W. 
Stenholm was assigned to 
the House Agriculture 
Committee, January 17, his 
first choice for Committee 
assignment. While cam ­
paigning for Congress, 
Stenholm frequently men­
tioned his background ill' 
agriculture and the impor­
tance such an assignment 
would have for the 17th 
District of Texas. The 
Congressman intends to be 
active in the legislative 
process and will use his new 
post to work toward 
meaningful legislation to in­
sure a good return on in­
vestment for the 
agricultural producers and 
an adequate supply for our 
consumers.

Congressman Stenholm 
would like to express his ap­
preciation to the people of 
the 17th District who helped 
make this possible and 
would be pleased to hear 
their views on matters that 
concern them. The newly 
elected Congressman ex­
pressed gratitude that his 
request to the Leadership in 
the House was received so 
favorably.

\ INVITATIONS 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 

NAPKINS 
BRIDAL BOOKS 
ACCESSORIES 

See it today!
KNOX

COUNTY
NEWS

derson came to visit Mr. 
Snelson.

Mr. Waldrip entertained 
Margaret Hill of Munday, 
Demp Emerson, Lloyd 
Waldrip and Ford and Dick 
Carney.

Weldon Glasscock was 
happy to see J.B. and Edna 
Eubank of Truscott.

Lola Mae and Evelyn Un­
derwood dropped in to see 
Mrs. Pray.

Kelton Smith was 
delighted to have Dimple 
Eddington, Travis Boyd, 
Kate Wheeler, Chester 
Jones, Bessie King, Bessie 
Duncan, Roy Lee Jones, 
Lillie Washington, Johnnie 
Brown, Verna Dean John­
son, Ammie Jo Flye, Mary 
Ledesma, Carny Play, 
Corine McKinney, Kenneth 
Burt, Laura Benson, Lucille 
Abbott, Estaline Mannign 
and his mother and daddy.

Mr. Thomas visited his 
wife Blanche.

Cliff Elliott was happy to 
see her sisters Blanche and 
Jo Strickland and Kay Sim­
pson.

Mr. and Mrs. Grimsley of 
Muleshoe visited Vicie Pearl 
Emerson.

Eda Fay Pounds 
welcomed her aunt and un­
cle, Mr. and Mrs. Dave 
Davidson of Rochester.

Mrs. Partridge enjoyed 
Marvin and Flora Myers of 
Crowell and Ruby McNeill.

Mae Flowers welcomed 
Travis Boyd, the Dewey 
Darrs, Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Lusk of Haskell, Eldora 
Gray, Corine McKinney and 
Lorena Burnison.

Mrs. Alvis was happy to 
see her son of Rochester and 
her daughter, Elaine 
Grover.

Mrs. Bearing entertained 
Travis Boyd, Carl Chapin 
and Lorena Burnison.

At Wednesday’s meeting. 
President Bill Baker an­
nounced that he had to call 
off last week’s Lions meeting 
on account of one of the 
cooks was sick. Today the 
president presented a 15 
year chevron to Lion David 
Counts.

Zone Chairman James 
Patterson announced the 
Lions’ mid-winter conferen­
ce would be at Comanche on 
January 27, and all Lions of­
ficers were especially in­
vited. Also, the chairmen’s 
next zone ^meeting was 
called for January 29 at 
Haskell and all officers are 
encouraged to attend.

No program today. The 
president» held a called 
meeting of officers after the 
Wednesday meal and had 
discussion on coming donut 
sale and then the broom sale 
in May. Other items of in­
terest to the club were 
discussed and ‘ then 
dismissed.

Knox City Superintendent 
of Schools W.R. Baker ad­
dressed members of the 
Knox City Study"Club Thur­
sday afternoon, January 18, 
at two-thirty o’clock in the 
Community Center.

Myrtle White, program 
leader, introduced Baker 
who gave the history of the 
Knox City School including 
facts and school changes 
throughou^the years. He 
discussed school finance at 
length, touching on the sub­
jects of history, legislation,:

i n p l a i n | I e w  ^
Mr. and Mrs. Randy Whit- 

sitt were in Plainview recen­
tly to be with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. O.Rl Whitsitt, 
during the death of his 
father’s brother, Ed Whitsitt 
of Beaumont.

While there, they got 
acquainted with their new 
nephew, Justin Lynn Whit­
sitt, son of Mr. and Mrs. An­
dy Whitsitt, also of Plain- 
view.

Letter To 
The Editor

Fort Worth, TX
In your paper a few weeks 

ago concerning the age of the 
old City Hall Fire Station, it 
was built the fall of 1928. 
R.B. Jones and Hershel 
Melton were contractors and 
I worked for them.

I.L. (Ike) Hudson
(Editor’s Note: Thank you 
so much for the information, 
Mr. Hudson. We appreciate 
your taking the time to let us 
know.)

VISIT HERE
J.B. Eubank of Paducah 

and his sister, Edna Eubank 
of Crowell, visited briefly 
Thursday of last week with 
Mrs. Grady Benedict and the 
Buddy Angles.

IN CHILDRESS 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Smith 

were in Childress Sunday 
visiting with Mrs. Henrietta 
Smith and Mrs. Jean Ann 
Coyle.

and taxes. Baker’s overall 
admonition to the group was 
study and keep up with 
proceedings in regard to 
taxation.’

Sudia Cash led the group in 
reading, “ A Collect for Club 
Women,’ ’ and the club 
project for helping with the 
town parking area was 
discussed and referred to a 
committee

For the February meeting, 
members were reminded to 
bring articles for “ Care Kit­
s’ ’ including wigs for the 
M.D. Anderson Hospital.

Members are also to bring 
to Mrs. Cash books published 
by Texas women authors or 
books written and published 
about a Texas woman. These 
books may be poetry, novels, 
cookbooks, biographies, 
historical, religious, subjec­
ts, or pamphlets. Mrs. Cash 
also said that paperbacks 
are welcome.

These books will be sent to 
TFWC headquarters to be 
placed in the TFWC 
Woman’s Library and kept 
permamently under “ Lock 
and Key.’ ’

Nine members were 
present including Winifred 
White, Charlotte Griffith, 
Gladys Reed, Sudia Cash, 
Virginia Casey, Sammie 
Carpenter, Myrtle White, 
Lillian Logan, and Lena 
McGee. One visitor, Mar­
jorie Baker, was also 
present.

FROM CROWELL 
Mr. and Mrs, Don Welch, 

Mitzi and Mandi of Crowell, 
visited during the weekend 
with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lloyd Waldrip, and her 
grandmother, Mrs. A.W. 
McBeath.

IN FORT WORTH 
The Z.I. Smiths visited in 

Fort Worth over the 
weekend with their daughter 
and her family, the Harold 
Statts. They also visited with 
Mrs. Smith’s mother, Mrs. 
Nomah Francisco.

.45 Years Young
$64.5 Million Strong

why Settle For Less 

Than The Maxium Interest 
You Can On Your 

Savings Accounts!

ANNUAL RATES 
8.00% 8-Yr. Cert. 

$1,000.00 Min.

•ANNUAL YIELDS
8.33%

7.75% 6-Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

8.06%

7.50% 4-Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

7.79%

6.75% 2V2-Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

6.98%

6.50% 1 -Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

6.72%

5.75% 90-Day Cert.
$500.00 Min.

. -/V- '■
5.92%

5.25% Passbook Account 
. \Open For $5.00 or More

5.39%

• I F  I N T E R E S T  IS  L E F T  T O  C O M P O U N D  C O N T I N U O U S L Y  F O R  12 M O N T H S
A  S U B S T A N T I A L  I N T E R E S T  P E N A L T Y  I S  R E Q U I R E D  F O R  E A R L Y  W I T H D R A W A L  F R O M  C E R T I F I C A T E S

THE NEW MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATE
•  Minimum deposit is $ 1 0 ,0 0 0 ‘
•  Earns .2 5 %  more than the current treasury bills*
•  Term is 26 weeks
•  Interest is compounded dody
•  Funds are  insured to $40 ,000  by the F.S.L.I.C.
•  Federal regulations require a substantial penalty for 

early  withdrawals from certificate accounts
*A sk  about the current rates on the "M oney Market Certificate"

4-
FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND 

LOAN ASSN. OF STAMFORD

FSTJC
Home Office:
1 22 W  McH arg  
P O. Box 51 1 
Stamford, Texas 79553

Branch Office:
No. 3 Avenue D 
P. O. Box 444  
Haskell,  Texas 79521  
Phonr̂  864-3j79 'c:

Division Office:
Q u a n a h  Federal Savings 

c:nd Loan
313 South M ain  St. 
Q u a n a h ,  Texas 79252
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Patients Dismissed 
Since January 13,1979 

Knox City; Tom Thomas, 
Zeola Corley, Lance Dever, 
Othella Walker, Nena Alvis, 
Cecilia Rocha (deceased), 
Rita Ramos, Lindsay 
Fisher Julian Garcia. 
Graham: AndrewDePriest. 
Munday: John McMahon, 
Bert Griffin (deceased), 
E.Y. Johnson, Lucy Bradly, 
Cynthia Dockins.
Benjamin: Pat Benson. 
Rochester: Ollie Yarbrough, 
Shirley Sloan.
Rhineland: S.E. Williamson. 
Arlington: Wesley Garrison.

Patients In Hospital 
As Of January 20, 1979 

Knox City: C.H. Mon­
tgomery, Gregorio Pedroya, 
Arabelle Rogers, Eva Pen­
man, Louise Finley, Mary 
Hope Carr.
Rochester: Pauline Bell, 
Sudie Ballard.
O’Brien: A.A. Cox 
Benjamin: Walter Clower 
Munday: Lois Trimmier, 
Guadalupe Lopez, Carl 
Hamilton, Florine Wilde, 
Annie Holder,
Gilliland: J.T. Cook 
Truscott: Harold Barry.

...that 25 percent o f auto­
mobile owners, 98 percent o f 
the world’s airlines and mil­
lions o f  truck operators use 
Retreaded tires?

... that retreaded tires can 
be sold at about half o f the 
price o f a new tire because 70 
percent o f the cost o f a tire

is in its casing, which is re­
cycled through retreading?

... that it takes seven gal­
lons o f ‘Crude oil to produce 
the average new automobile 
tire but only two and a half 
gallons to retread one? At 
that rate the more than 30 
million . retreaded tires sold 
in one recent year saved 135 
million gallons o f crude oil.

Give To The 
March Of Dimes

Margaret’s
802 EAST MAIN

Weekend Specials
Good Thurs. — Fri. — Sat.

We reserve the right to limit,

EBNER’S N0.1 SLICED Q Q

BACON .LbPRg^l^^
1 GAL. PLASTIC JUG I J Q

PRESTON MILK H
PRESTON 1 GAL. PLASTIC JUG ^  P Q

LOW FAT MILK
GLADIOLA P T  O  ^

FLOUR 5LbBag70^

Pork Chops loLb 80x^16®®
MEATS

Pork Chops, T-Bones, Rib-eye Steaks,
Carl’s Pork Sausage,

Club Steaks and Cured Hams

STOP EXPENSIVE PAINTING
United States Steel Siding

UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING 
ALUMINUM REPLACEMENT WINDOWS

100% FINANCING AVAILABLE

C.W. ‘Dutch’ Benson Construction
Authorized Dealer

BENJAMIN PHONE 817 454-2281

FROM COLORADO 
John LaFont of Creede, 

Colorado, visited several 
days last week with Jeanette 
Clarke and family.

MAYTAG JET CLEAN DISHWASHERS OUT CLEAN THEM ALL! •  MAYTAG

Factory Direct Sale

factory refund
on new MsQTtag Jetdean 
” dishwashers

Save *25 with factory 
savings certificate in 
current magazines 

and Cascade cartons

WIN a new Maytag 
Jetclean Dishwasher

0 MAlTAG/(OOIlle
Clean Sweep sUlhes
>0.1 c.»n WMfi one ».• lOO M A T 1AG tn woe Of tOO
One Ytr^r 5 Soppiy u l CASCADE deie>qeni

ENTER NOW ! No pui^ridso reqa n-o Ja^l ttiOiL-
•n and PM, A-uf» v*mi c*-l(y tiijnh lijn ileM-is

MAYTAG Jetdean Dishwasher 
OUT CLEANS 
ALL OTHERS

1 ^

E
MAMACi

• Tested exclusive Maytag Jet- 
wash action/Compare/Smaller 
holes mean high velocity jet 
spray • Energy Saving cycle 
dries without heat • New styl­
ing, smart colors • Tested ex­
clusive Maytag Micro-Mesh’" 
Filter _ 5

liSUOOSSIGSI

MAYTAG

Maytag
Big Tub Washer

• Energy-efficient operation
• All fabric cycle selection • 
Power Fin'" agitator • Self­
cleaning, long-lasting porce­
lain tub • Built to last longer 
and need fewer repairs.

MAYTAG
II

Maytag
Big Load Dryer
• Fast, energy-efficient 
operation • Big capacity to 
handle big loads • Low temp 
Stream-of-Heat'" drying • 
Convenient lint filter • End of 
cycle signal reminder.

%

Munday Tire & Appliance
210 SOUTH MUNDAY AVENUE

MUNDAY, TEXAS PHONE 422-4821

Cv

o—

'C*

o
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S U P E R

KNOX CITY

DOUBLE
S & H GREEN STAMPS 

W E D N E S D A Y S
With The Purchase 
0( S2 50 Or More

SPECIALS GOOD 
THUR.,FRI.,SAT.,
JAN. 25 26 27

FOOD D iscoum s

$ M R S .  PAUL 'S  FROZEN

FISH STICKS or 
SEAFOOD PLATTER

9 -oz .
PKG.

CHARMIN
TOILET TISSUE

%Moffton regular 
dinners

M O R T O N  FROZEN

DINNERS
ASSORTED K I N D S

TIDE
DETERGENT

G I A N T
BOX

.  Q U A LITY

®0DNDPEEU®
t o m a t o e s

1.18
LI MI T 1 - WI TH 1 0 . 0 0  
GR OC E R Y  PURCHASE.

@ ntadina.
ROUND TOMATOES

| 9 <
REALEMON

I  @ 10 1 ii I  a  ̂s 4, @ ♦ 0 i   ̂@  ̂sJU .
«»■»» M»Ti orn SrST SSJ? •SSf ••••■- m m*M-n u»Ti m n  ■'

_______ BOUNTY

S T O R E  W I D E  i z :  PAPER
TOWELS

J U M B O  f t O U  I I I  . ^ A j j  

T R O P H Y  FROZEN A

Ei" Strawberries i“
lO-OT. 1 0 0

^  PKGS. ■  ■

COTTAGE CHEESE
S H U R F R ES H  A

R D H D E A C V e  *  ^  ^  . n  y u . i .
» i i E f i i 9 l ^  l e w  7  1  I | j |

C O N T A D IN A

TOMATO SAUCE
8 - ox .  1 0 0
CANS ■

POTATO CHIPS
S H U R F R ES H  M  Ai

DOG FOOD I
STRONG 15-oz. V O O  ~
HEART ^^NS ■

i t
I 4J^ - OZ.  

C A N

LEMON JUICE
3 2 - o z . B OT T L E

18- oz .
BOTTLE

4 6 - o z .
C A N

¥ 0  s

GEBHARDT'S CHILI
No Beans  
15-oz .Can  

Limit 3

Green G ian t  Golden
WH. KERNE L C A D i l  
CR.STYLE % W l i R

KRAFT

Barbecue Sauce
Green G iant  Cut

Green Beans

Hl-C
FRUIT  D R IN K S  

Assorted Flavors

HAIR SRAY
A Q U A  NET  
1 0 - o z . C A N  
1 . 39  V a l u e

OIL OF OLAY
4-OZ. lOIlOK

2.99
NdTHOlLIUM
DEEP HEAT

3-OZ. TUIL
Z.7» f  ( 
VtlUE I  •

s  8  S I a *


