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Six Food Winners 
Show ‘Good Taste’

Six youths took top honors 
in the Knox County 4-H Food 
Show Saturday, January 13, 
in Munday.

Winners earned first-place 
awards in two divisions, 
senior and junior, which 
each included four classes.

First place winners in the 
senior division were Robert 
Sutton of Knox City, breads 
and desserts, and Cindy 
Maston of Munday, snacks 
and beverages.

First place winners in the 
junior division were Lana 
Gideon of Benjamin, snack 
and beverages; Lori Griffith 
of Benjamin, side dish; 
Michael Rauch of Knox City, 
bread and desserts; and 
Pam Welch of Munday, main 
dish.

Others earning blue rib­
bons in the junior main dish 
were Cliff Hacker of Knox 
City, Christy Morgan, Julie 
Partridge, and Holly Hut­
chinson, all of Munday. Also, 
Debbie Bufkin, Twylah 
Pierce, and Christi Ray of 
Benjamin.

In the junior bread and 
desserts, Beverly Tolson and 
Tina Ray of Benjamin 
received blue awards. Molly 
Grimes, Amy Parker and 
Cindy Berryhill of Munday 
received red awards.

Bobby Faye Toliver of 
Munday received a blue rib­
bon in junior side dish and 
Toni Benson of Benjamin 
received a red ribbon.

Those receiving blue 
awards in the junior snack 
and beverages were Becky 
Griffith, Sue Gideon, and 
Lorrie Ralston of Benjamin; 
and Amanda Abell of Mun­
day. Earning red ribbons 
were Sheri Parker, Sulynn 
Oxford, and Oscar Gideon, 
all of Benjamin.

Judging the event was 
Mrs, Veeta Reid of O’Brien 
and Bobby Hudson of Ben­
jamin.

Leaders for the foods 
projects were Mrs. Jimmie 
Ryder, Mrs. Sue Oxford, and 
Mrs. Jan Rolston from Ben­
jamin. Knox City leaders 
were Mrs. Sherry Hacker, 
Mrs. Mary Rauch, and Mrs. 
Pearl Eaton. Munday 
leaders were Mrs. Joan Hut­
chinson, Mrs. Mary Huf­
fman, and Mrs. Frances 
Parker.

F if ty - f iv e  m e m b e rs , 
leaders, and parents atten­
ded the tasting tea following 
the judging.

4-H is open to any youth, 
ages 9-19 regardless of socio­
economic levels, race, color, 
sex, religion or national 
origin.

PROUDLY DISPLAYING a rosette for first place, 
along with a first blue ribbon in the Knox Coun­
ty Food Show Saturday, is Rob Sutton, a fresh­
man and son of Mr. and Mrs. Gene Sutton. Rob 
won in the senior division, breads and desserts.

EQUALLY AS proud of his rosette and biue rib­
bon for first piace in the junior division, breads 
and desserts, is Michael Rauch, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Rauch.

Sales Tax 
Rebates Are 
Received

AUSTIN - State Com­
ptroller Bob Bullock Monday 
said the January allocationof 
the local option one percent 
sales tax to Texas cities will 
exceed $18.1 million.

This month’s rebate is 
about $300,000 less than the 
state paid to some 900 Texas 
cities during the same one- 
month period last year.

Texas cities received a 
record $424.8 million during 
1978 as their share of the city 
sales tax, an increase of 17 
percent over the previous 
year, Bullock said.

Knox City received 
$1,100.13 for the period en­
ding December 29, 1978, 
Munday had $1,069.25, 
Haskell received $2,741.55, 
Seymour had $2,071.35, and 
Stamford’s net amount was 
$2,520.56.

Amounts for the towns of 
O’Brien, Rochester, Rule, 
and Benjamin were not 
computed for the period.

The sales tax is collected 
by m erchants and other 
sales tax permit holders 
along with the state sales tax 
and is rebated monthly to 
cities in which it is collected 
by the Comptroller’s Office.

Last Week’s 
Samples 
Total 9700

About 9700 cotton samples 
were classed during the 
week ending January 12, 
bringing the season total to 
48,000 at Munday.

Cotton prices dropped 
about 100 points on Thur­
sday, according to Sidney 
Ferrell in charge of the 
Munday Marketing Services 
Office. Prices being quoted 
now range from 1000 to 1075 
points above current CCC 
loan levels. Producer and 
buyer activity is very light.

Grade 42 was the 
predominant quality with 33 
percent. Grade 41 accounted 
for 19 percent and Grade 51 
was 15 percent. Grades 32 
and 52 each accounted for 14 
percent of the cotton classed 
during the week. About 35 
percent of the cotton was 
reduced in grade because of 
bark or grass.

Staple 32 continued as the 
predominant fiber length 
with 67 percent. Staple 31 ac­
counted for 18 percent and 
Staple 33 was 15 percent. 
Micronaire readings con­
tinued to decline as only 69 
percent of the cotton was in 
the base range of 35 to 49. 
Twenty-six percent tested in 
the 30 to 34 range and 5 per­
cent was below 30.
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Knox-Haskell Groundwater 
Study To Be Released Friday

The Texas Department of 
Water Resources and Rollen 
W. Hardin, Hardin and 
A ssocia tes E ng ineering  
Firm, Austin, will release a 
forty-month study of the 
Seymour Aquifer at a 
meeting on Friday, January 
19, at 1:30 p.m. in the Mun­
day Chamber of Commerce 
and Agriculture Office. The 
public is invited, according 
to Callie Ann Combs, 
secretary of the Munday 
Chamber.

The study was initiated by 
the Munday Chamber some 
four years ago when area 
residents became concerned 
with various types of 
pollution of the Aquifer. The 
concentrated study will

Water Rates 
To Increase

Water rates for Knox City 
customers will be increasing 
effective with the March 
billings, according to Faye 
Railsback, city secretary- 
manager. Other rates for 
garbage collection and 
nightwatching will remain 
the same, Mrs. Railsback 
explained.

After Knox City began 
receiving water from the 
North Central Texas 
Municipal Water Authority 
last October, city officials 
decided to make the raise ef­
fective after the first of the 
year.

Previously, the minimum 
was 3,000 gallons for $5.50, 
and now the 5,000 minimum 
will cost the consumer 
$10.00. All amounts above 
the minimum will be $1.00 
per thousand.

evaluate approximately 1200 
samples of water taken from 
the aquifer to determine the 
pollution sources, both 
natural and man-made. It 
will include locations of 
domestic and irrigation 
wells, water tables, mineral 
contents of chosen wells as 
well as locations of oil wells, 
disposal wells and rates of 
transpoevaporation of the 
aquifer.

The engineering firm and 
the Water Resources Depar­
tment has worked closely 
with the Texas Railroad

O’Brien Tourney 
Reset This Week

Due to the return of last 
week’s bad weather 
situation, the O’Brien Junior 
High basketball tournament 
was canceled after four 
games were played last 
Tuesday.

The tourney resumed ac­
tion this week with eight 
girls’ and boys’ teams par­
ticipating.

According to Charles 
Reed, mid-school principal, 
six games will be played 
Thursday (today) with the 
remaining six games 
scheduled for Saturday.

Teams entered include 
both seventh and eighth 
grade teams from O’Brien, 
with Munday, Rochester, 
Weinert, Goree, Benjamin 
and Patton Springs par­
ticipating.

Did You Know...
that Mr. and Mrs. Z.B. 
Thomas of Robert Lee, 
Texas, subscribe to The 
Knox County News?

Weatherwise

1978 Year Of Extremes
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By MARTI TACKITT
1978 ... labeled by some as 

the ‘Drought Y ear’ and 
again, later, as the ‘Year of 
the Flood.’ Regardless of 
how it is labeled, 1978 will be 
remembered by many area 
people for the severity of its 
extreme climatic differen­
ces.

The long dry spell, of­
ficially declared as begin­
ning in July, 1977, and con­
tinuing on through what is 
normally the “rainy” season 
for this area to February of 
1978, cost local farmers most 
of their wheat crop and 
caused late plantings later 
on in the year of cotton and 
maize; much of which is still 
in the field now. The area 
didn’t really receive enough 
moisture, however, until 
August, when a downpour 
over a total of three con­
secutive days brought an 
unofficial 14 inches of rain to 
Knox County and a flooding 
17 inches to neighboring 
Haskell County, destroying 
crops and property alike in 
one gigantic wash.

Knox County was twice 
declared a disaster area due 
to the fractious weather, and 
over $1,300,000 (approx.) 
was loaned to area farmers 
through disaster aid, 
economic emergency and 
low yield payment 
programs.

According to the weather 
station at the Plant 
Materials Center north of 
Knox City, the coldest day in 
1978 was February 18, when 
a chilly four degrees was 
registered. The hottest day 
of the year was July 15, at 
114 degrees. 1977’s record 
low and high temperatures

SS Rep Visit 
Rescheduled

A representative of the 
Vernon Social Security office 
will be in Knox City at the 
City Hall Thursday, January 
18 (today), from 10:(X) a.m. 
until noon to assist you with 
any of your social security 
problems.

The meeting was 
scheduled for last Thursday, 
but due to inclement weather 
it was rescheduled.
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FURNISHED BY PLANT 
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4 Miles NW of Knox City
date low high
1-9 24 41
1-10 25 34
1-11 24 35
1-12 33 50
1-13 16 36
1-14 13 30
1-15 24 43

rain

.34

Tr.

were six and 107 degrees.
Comparing the rainfall of 

the two years, January ’78 
received a mere two-tenths 
of an inch of rain compared 
with January ’77’s 1.3 in­
ches; February ’78 gained 
over two inches of moisture, 
compared with February 
’77’s three-tenths of an inch. 
March, April and May of the 
past year were considerably 
lower than 1977, however, 
recording two-tenths, one- 
tenth and 2.2 inches respec­
tively, compared with 1.3,2.8 
and 5.5 inches in 1977. June 
1978 earned a more respec­
table 1.9 inches of rain, com­
pared with 1977’s 1.3 inches. 
July ’77 and ’78 both brought 
four-tenths of an inch of the 
wet stuff; August 1978 
claims a big 7.3 inches total, 
while only 1.4 inches were 
received in 1977. The 
moisture level for the 
remainder of the year was 
quite a bit more than that 
received in ’77: 4.8 com­
pared with two-tenths in Sep­
tember; 1.3 compared with 
six-tenths in October; over 
one inch compared with 
three-tenths in November; 
and seven-tenths compared 
with the previous five- 
hundredths in December.

Total moisture received 
officially was 22.3 inches in 
1978, as compared with 15.5 
inches in 1977.
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Commission in collecting 
material for this study. They 
have also worked with an 
area advisory committee 
who has served for four 
years with input into the 
study. The advisory commit­
tee members include M.L. 
Wiggins, chairman; Clint 
Norman and Callie Ann 
Combs of Munday; Calvin 
Christian, Seymour; A.A. 
Cox, O’Brien; and Joe B. 
Cloud of Rule.

Clothing 
Workshop 
Is Slated

The Texas 4-H center near 
Brownwood will host a 
weekend workshop for 4-H 
clothing project leaders on 
February 3 and 4.

Theme of the weekend 
training is “A Carrousel of 
Ideas,” and Assistant Coun­
ty Extension Agent Sharon 
Book invites all interested 4- 
H leaders or prospective 4-H 
leaders who want to sharpen 
their knowledge and skills in 
clothing to participate.

Instructors for the training 
sessions include Beverly 
Rhoades and Nancy Brown, 
e x te n s io n  c lo th in g  
specialists from College 
Station; (Jeorge McArthur, 
4-H and youth specialist. 
College Station; Teri DeBolt 
and Nancy Justice, both of 
Abilene.

Activities planned include 
a fashion show and fabric 
trends for ’79; makeup ap­
plication hints and exercise 
demonstrations to help com­
plement the new clothing 
ideas for ’79.

For further information 
and/or registration details, 
interested persons may call 
the Knox County Extension 
Office at (817) 454-2651.

Educational program s 
conducted by the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice serve persons of all ages 
regardless of socio-economic 
levels, race, color, sex, 
religion, or national origin.

Basketball
Results
BOYS VARSITY 

Tuesday, January 9 
Rule 47, Knox City 35 
Walling 9, Roberson 13, Gon­
zales 6, S. White 4, and A. 
White 3.
Friday, January 12 
Crowell 58, Knox City 48 
Rushing 6, Walling 10, John­
son 8, Roberson 20, Counts 2, 
A. White 2.

VARSITY GIRLS 
Rule 466 7 =  23
Knox City 10 9 910 =  38 
Rhonda Skiles 10, Kay 
Howell 15, Tammie Helton 2, 
Gerri Watson 4, Gaylynn 
Burkham 2, and Brenda 
Albus 5.
Crowell 8101117 =  46
Knox City 6 8 8 4 =  26 
Skiles 8, Howell 2, Helton 10, 
Hutchinson 6.

JUNIOR VARSITY
Crowell 5 3 4 8 =  20
KnoxCity 0261 = 9
Angie Bateman 1, Kelly 
Watson 2, Chayo Garcia 6.

Special invitations to the 
meeting have been extended 
to State Senator Ray 
Farabee, R epresentative 
W.S. ‘Bill’ Heatly, Directors 
of the Texas Railroad Com­
mission in Abilene and 
Wichita Falls D istricts, 
county judges, mayors, city 
secretaries, and ASCS and 
Soil Conservation offices in 
the area. A limited number 
of copies of this report will 
be made available at the 
meeting. Other copies will be 
available from the Munday 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture, and the Texas 
Department of Water 
Resources, 1700 N. Congress 
Avenue, Austin, Texas 78711, 
Mrs. Combs said.

Financial 
Aid Meeting 
January 22

A review of the process of 
applying for financial aid for 
college students will be 
presented by Mrs. LaRue 
Reeves, school counselor, 
Monday, January 22, at 9:30 
a.m. at the Knox City High 
School.

The process includes the 
following steps:

1. Student completes the 
Family Financial Statement 
and the Student Data Form 
and mails both in the pre­
addressed envelope. The 
forms may be mailed any 
time after January 1,1979.

2. Student receives the 
Student Financial Aid 
Report (SFAR). The SFAR: 
a) Lets students know ACT 
has received and processed 
the FFS. b) Gives students 
the chance to check all in­
formation and make any 
changes if necessary, c) 
Sends messages from the in­
stitution and ACT to the 
student.

3. Institutions coded 
rece iv e  co m p reh en siv e  
Financial Aid Report 
(CFAR). TheCFAR: a) Con­
tains all information submit­
ted on the FFS. b) Contains 
complete meeds analysis in­
formation, BEOG eligibility 
information, etc.

4. Institution notifies 
student of aid award 
decision.

The Family Financial 
Statement forms, the CCS 
Financial Aid Forms and the 
Basic Education Oppor­
tunity Grant Forms are 
available in Mrs. Reeves’ of­
fice. She will also have the 
Student Financial Assistan­
ce Filmstrip Presentation 
ready for viewing at one’s 
request.

School And 
Community 

Calendar
JanuaryWednesday, 

Noon Lions.
17 -

Thursday, January 18 - Knox 
City Study Club, 2:30 p.m.

Friday, January 19 -
Quanah, here, 5:00, GGB.

Tuesday, January 23 - Mun­
day, here, 5:00, BGB.
Thursday, January  25 - 
Weinert, here, 6:00, eighth 
grade GB; seventh and 
eighth grade girls and boys 
in Haskell Tourney.
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TO BUY?  

TO SELL? 
RESULTS?

Miscellaneous 
For Sale

FOR SALE - Fireplace 
wood, $45.00 a cord at farm. 
Lloyd Waldrip, 658-3137.

10-26 tfc

WE ALSO HAVE yard and 
garden fertilizer. See Her­
bert Bellinghausen or call 
658-3817. 3-30 tfc

KNOX COUNTY HISTORY - 
Indexed, $15.60 plus $1.00 
mailing. Available now at 
Citizens State Bank in Knox 
City or write Knox County 
History, Truscott, Texas 
79260. 12-216tc

FOR SALE - Baled Sudan 
Hay. Buy in field and save. 
David Counts, 658-3211 or 
658-35%. 10-12 tfc

SEE YOUR MONUMENTS 
before you buy. More than 50 
designs to choose from. Also 
curb work. J.C. McGee.

10-21 tfc

MINNOWS, Bass, Crappie 
and Trotline Minnows, Stink 
Bait, Shrimp, Worms now 
available at The Country 
Store, .2 miles east of City 
Cafe, Mrs. L.D. (Irene) San­
derson. 12-14 tfc

COTTON S T R IP P E R
Bearings and U Joints, Plow 
Discs, Krause Plow Parts, 
Service Shredder Parts, 
Bearings, Oil Filters, Belts, 
Delco Batteries for Tractors, 
Pickups and Cars, also Plugs 
and Points. EGENBACHER 
IMPLEMENT, INC. 11-30 tfc

WOODARD FARM SALES, 
Haskell, Texas. Ford trac­
tors, equipment, long 
harrows, Lilliston, Hesston, 
Oliver plow parts. 4-13 tfc

HAY FOR SALE - Walter 
Rauch, 658-3440. 6-15 tfc

AUTO - State Farm insures 
more cars than any other 
company at deviated rates. 
LIFE - Generous dividends 
to all policy holders.
FIRE - Rates that currently 
average 25% less than Stan­
dard Texas Homeowners 
rates.
HEALTH - Provides a broad 
package of protection to help 
meet the rising cost of 
medical services.
FINANCE - Autos and boats 
at lower interest.

LEO FETSCHrAGENT 
Ph: Off.817/422-4259 

Hwy.267, Munday TX 76371

FOR SALE - Large wood 
heater with built-in oven. 
Also, heater without oven. 
Call 658-3172. 1-18 Itc

ORGAN IN STORAGE -1978 
Home Model Organ stored 
locally. Reported like new. 
Responsible party  can 
assume low balance. 
Automatic rhythm, walking 
boogie bass, single finger 
chords, banjo, etc. Call per­
son-to-person collect; Mr. 
R o b e r ts ,  512-459-8660. 
National Keyboard, Inc., 
Aust în ,̂TX. 1-18 2tp

Lost And 
Found

Miscellaneous
Services

BAYLOR MILLING CO.
Throckmorton Highway, 
Seymour. Custom mixing - 
pelleting - your grain or 
ours. Range cubes, creep 
feeds, hog feeds, start to 
finish. 888-3921. 5-11 tfc

INSULATION: We have the 
finest. Contact Dennis Duke, 
phone (817) 454-3561 or 
Derrell Marion, phone (817) 
658-3249. 4-27 tfc

OSCAR’S TV SERVICE - 
Zenith Dealer, Zenith 
Chromacolor 11 and B/W, 8- 
track taped and auto tape 
decks. In-shop service.
Phone 658-3647. 3-23 tfc

BUDDY TOLSON
WELDING SERVICE - Por­
table welding on farm and 
ranch. Will build pens and 
barns. Phone 454-3231, Ben­
jamin. 3-3 tfc
WATER WELL DRILLING -
Irrigation, stock wells, test 
holes, $7 ft. for house wells. 
W.P. Hise, Haskell, Texas 
( 8 r ) 864-3727, day or night.

HEDGETRIMMING and 
yard cleaning. Call J.L. 
Smith, 658-3769, at night.

1-18 Itp

Card Of 
Thanks

To each of those who ex­
pressed concern for me in 
any way during my recent 
hospitalization I want to say 
thank you sincerely. Also I 
want to say that we are truly 
blessed to have a hospital 
here in our midst in our time 
of need. I am thankful for 
our wonderful doctors and 
for every member of the 
staff who in their efficient 
way keeps the wheels tur­
ning for our physical com­
fort and recovery.

Mary Alice Thompson 
1-18 Itc

CARD OF THANKS 
Our sincere thanks and 

appreciation to all our frien­
ds for being so nice and kind 
during our sad bereavement. 
Your cards, visits, flowers, 
calls and words of sympathy 
will always be remembered.

Special thanks to the East- 
side Baptist Church for the 
food and to Smith Funeral 
Home for such a nice ser­
vice. May God bless each of 
you.

The Family of 
1-18 Itp J.W. McMahan

Wanted

STRAYED - Black cow with 
D— on left hip. Last seen 
west of O’Brien on river. Call 
655-3958 if seen. 1-18 Up

FOUND - Daisy key ring 
with three GM keys. Owner 
will pay for this ad and claim 
keys at KC News office.

USE
THE

CLASSIFIEDS

HELP WANTED - CAREER 
OPPORTUNITY IN FOOD 
MANAGEMENT. Richeson 
Restaurants, Dairy Queen, 
need manager trainees to 
relocate. Excellent salary 
plus incentive bonuses put 
you well up in the 5 digit 
salary category. Company 
insurance, free meals and 
paid vacation. Male or 
female. Mature adult. Need 
no experience in food. Learn 
in our training school. Must 
be willing to learn speed 
cooking as well as 
management. Phone (817) 
549-5041. Hours 9:00 to 4:00, 
weekdays. 1-4 4tc

RELIABLE HELP needed 
for work on metal building 
and some concrete work. 
Homer Rolston, (817) 454- 
3341. 12-21tfc

WANTED - Used merchan­
dise. Lee Used Furniture, 
Stamford, Texas, 773-5608.

4-20 tfc

C hurch  S c h o o l 10:00
M o rn in g  W orship  11:00
E vening  W orship  6:00

James P. Patterson, Pastor

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

RESIDENTIAL
LARGE 2-bedroom house, kitchen, living room, 1 bath, 
carport, rock fence, 3 pecan trees. You will not believe 
how nice this house is inside until you see it. 1107 South 
3rd.
SUPER BUY - Custom built 2 bedroom brick home - den, 2 
baths, living room, garage, homemaker’s dream kitchen. 
Located on 3 acres 4V̂  miles from KC.
2400 SQ. FT, of country home on 5.6 acres. 4 bedrooms on 3 
levels, den with fireplace and great view. Basement 
playroom or 5th bedroom, utility room, kitchen with built- 
in oven and cooktop, dining room, 2 baths, wood shingles, 
2 car carport, 5 inch water well, horse lots and barn. Nice 
set up - ready now. This is the Rick Barnard home. Shown 
by appointment only by David Counts only.
IF YOU NEED lots of room, look at this; 5 bedroom, den, 
living room, kitchen, 2 baths, new paint inside and out, 
new roof, carpet, nice lot. Reasonable price. 802 South 
Central.
NEED LOTS OF ROOM? 1778 square feet of easy living. 
Fireplace, ce^^^, d ^ ,  livinglTimm, kitchen, three 
bedrooms, lauimN riom, pudy joryourth bedroom, two 
bathrooms. Ydtiimll TOverTlnd tlfis much room for this 
price again. 901 South Second.
EXCELLENT 3-acre tract. East edge of O’Brien on FM, 
2 bedroom, kitchen, dining room, 1 bath. Good buy. Hazel 
Clark place.

COMMERCIAL
BEAUTY SHOP building in Rochester. Would make a 
great lake cabin. Will sell to move or with lot. Good buy.
BOB’S SHOE SHOP in Haskell. Large main building, 2- 
bedroom house, 6 small buildings. Some rented at this 
time. Lots of sq. ft. 1V2 acres of land. $28,000. 
INVESTMENT REAL ESTATE - Texaco Service Station 
with 36,000 gallon storage. (Jood location. Priced to sell. 
FRAME BUILDING, formerly Hocus Pocus on East 
Main.
FOR SALE - Smith Liquid Gas property. Excellent 
location for your business.
FOR SALE - Feed store with office and large warehouse, 
(jrood business.
FOR SALE - Iron clad building on West Main.

FARM & RANCH
138 ACRES in northwest Haskell County. Some coastal 
grass, some pasture but mostly cultivated. Water 
available for irrigation. 3 stock water wells. Some 
working pens. Excellent hunting

m
PEALTOP*

DAVID COUNTS 
Insurance and Real Estate 

102 N. Ave. A. 
(817)658-3211

THREE BEDROOM, two 
bath home, extra large 
living room, den and kit­
chen, new carpet, built-in 
dishwasher and stove, 
fireplace. Lots of storage, 
privacy fence, ap­
proximately 2700 square 
feet. Greg Clonts, 658-3340 or 
(512)255-2615. 6-29 tfc

FOR SALE - Large trailer 
house and 2 barns, 2 wells, 
lots other improvements, on 
approximately 1 acre, 4‘2 
miles north Knox City.
IN NEED OF LISTINGS, 
market very good. If you 
have something for sale, 
come see us.

3-BEDROOM, IV2 bath, den 
with fireplace, carport, fen­
ced yard, corner lot. Good 
buy. 1100 S. 5th St. 
3-BEDROOM, 1 bath, fenced 
yard, storm cellar, corner 
lot, 1008S. 4th.

arnold insurance 
and

real estate 
phone 658-3509

FOR RENT - Almost new 2- 
bedroom house in O’Brien 
with stove and refrigerator. 
Jonnie Roddy, call 658-3354.

FOR RENT - 3-bedroom 
house. D & D Rentals, 658- 
3262. 10-19 tfc

PRODUCING LEASE for 
sale, 1 mile NE Munday, 
Knox County; NE 120 acres. 
Sec. 27, L.W. Hobert; 4 
producing wells, Tannehill 
Sand 2100’; rights to all dep­
ths; 2 SWD wells; 75% lease, 
25% royalty; drillable acres 
in lease; 10 bbl. oil, 700 bbl. 
water daily; equipment in 
good to excellent condition; 
salvage equals selling price. 
Price: $80,000 FIRM. Con­
tact Ausanka Oil, 606 Oil & 
Gas Building, Wichita Falls; 
phone: 817-723-7321 days or 
767-3708 after 6 p.m. 1-11 Itc

Give 
To The 
March 

Of Dimes

406 S. Second Knox City, Texas

pi^sci^PTior]
SEIlViGE

PRESCRIPTIONS 
CONVALESCENT EQUIPMENT 

OTHER DRUG-RELATED ITEMS

Larson’s
Prescription Pharmacy

LARRY STAGGS RPh - Owner
658-3210 Res. 658-3223

NOTICE TO BANKS 
OF KNOX COUNTY 

As authorized and required 
by Article 2544, V.C.S. State 
of Texas, the Com­
missioners’ Court of Knox 
County at their regular 
meeting place will accept 
bids for designation as coun­
ty depository for Knox 
County funds until 10:00 
a.m., February 12, 1979. Any 
banking concern within the 
county desiring appointment 
as depository bank will file 
their bid application with 
County Judge of Knox Coun­
ty and must be in his hands 
by 10:00 a.m., February 12, 
1979.

/s / H.T. Melton 
H.T. Melton 

County Judge 
Knox County, Texas

1-11 2tc

THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE OF 
TEXAS CRIM INAL 
TRESPASS (SENATE BILL 
111 PASSED BY THE 62nd 
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
ALL LANDS OF W.T. 
WAGGONER ESTATE ARE 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

KILLEN M. MOORE 
TRUSTEE

Automobiles 
For Sale

FOR SALE - 1975 Chevrolet 
Pickup; heavy duty 
package, mags, sidepipes, 
luggage rack, MORE ... 
REAL SPORTY ... Make me 
a deal - see Jimmy Rushing. 
12-28 tfc

FOR SALE -1976 Pickup, 3/4 
ton, four-speed, long wheel 
base, clean. Alton F it­
zgerald, 658-3865. 1-4 tfc

FOR SALE - 1975 Pontiac 
Grand Prix. See at Skiles 
Exxon or contact Weldon 
Skiles. 1-18 tfc

1974 BUICK, lots of extras, 
one owner. David Counts.

1-4 tfc

Call In Your News 
658-3142

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
TO: EDGAR D. LEONARD, 
JOHN J. MERRILL, ROSE 
F. FITZGERALD AND 
DENNIS E. MAHONEY, 
Greeting:
You are commanded to ap­
pear by filing a written an­
swer to the plaintiff’s 
petition at or before ten 
o’clock a.m. of the first 
Monday after the expiration 
of 42 days from the date of 
issuance of this Citation, the 
same being Monday the 26th 
day of February, A.D., 1979, 
at or before ten o’clock a.m., 
before the Honorable 
District Court of Knox Coun­
ty, at the Court House in 
Benjamin, Texas.
Said plaintiff’s petition was 
filed on the 18th day of 
December, 1978. The file 
number of said suit being 
No. 6601.
The names of the parties in 
said suit are: Robert E. 
Vanderpool as Plaintiff, and 
Edgar D. Leonard, John J. 
Merrill, Rose E. Fitzgerald 
and Dennis E. Mahoney, as 
Defendants.
The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to 
wit: A suit for the appoin­
tment of a receiver with 
power and authority to 
execute, under order of the 
Court, an oil, gas and 
m ineral lease or leases 
covering the outstanding 
mineral interests owned or 
claimed by Defendants upon 
such terms and conditions as 
may be prescribed by the 
court (including pooling 
provisions), in and under the 
following described land in 
Knox County, Texas:
Mineral estate in Section 54, 
Block B, A-690, H&TC Ry. 
Co. Survey, Knox County, 
Texas, containing 676.5 
acres'; more or less.
If this Citation is not served 
within 90 days after the date 
of its issuance, it shall be

returned unserved.
Issued this the 11th day of 
January A.D., 1979.
Given under my hand and 
seal of said Court, at office in 
Benjamin, Texas, this the 
11th day of January A.D., 
1979.

/s / Gloria L. West, Clerk 
District Court, 

Knox County, Texas 
NO.6601

IN DISTRICT COURT, 
ROBERT E. VANDER­
POOL vs. Edgar D. Leonard, 
John J. Merrill, Rose E. Fit­
zgerald and Dennis E. 
Mahoney,
CITATION BY

PUBLICATION

T h e  K n o x  
C o u n t y  N e w s

P.O. Box 7
Knox City, Texas 79529 
Telephone 817 658-5142

Billye B. Angle........ Publisher ̂ Editor
Stacy Angle..............Assistant Editor
Published at Knox City, Texas 79529, 
every Thursday. Second Class Postage 
paid at Knox City, Texas 79529.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
One Year Subscription Within

50 miles of Knox City................ $6
One Year Elsewhere in Texas........ $7
One Year Out of State......................$8

NOTICE - Any erroneous reflection 
upon the character, standing, or 
reputation of any person, firm, or cor­
poration, which may apjxar in the 
columns of this paper will gladly be 
corrected upon notice of same being 
brought to the attention of the 
publisher.

Postmaster: Send change of 
address notices to The Knox 
County News, Box 7, Knox 
( îty, Texas 79529.

M a r g a r e t ’ s
802 EAST MAIN

Weekend Specials
Good Thurs. — Fri. — Sat.

We reserve the right to limit.

GOLD MEDAL

FLOUR .5 Lbs

MARYLAND CLUB

COFFEE .2 Lb,

PRESTON ONE GALLON PLASTIC JUG

MILK
PRESTON ONE GALLON PLASTIC JUG

LOW FAT MILK

TAB 12 Oz. Can - 6 Pack

78<=
$424

$179

$ 1 5 9

9 8 ^
MEATS

Pork Chops, T-Bones, Rib-eye Steaks, 
Carl’s Pork Sausage,

Club Steaks and Cured Hams

STOP EXPENSIVE PAINTING
United States Steel Siding

UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING 
ALUMINUM REPLACEMENT WINDOWS

100% FINANCING AVAILABLE

C.W. ‘Dutch’ Benson Construction
Authorized Dealer

BENJAMIN PHONE 817 454-2281

T R Y I N G  T O  R E M E M B E R  
Y O U R  T A X  D E D U C T I O N S ?
If you’ve had a nightmare trying to remember all your tax deductions, you’ve probably 
learned your lesson the hard way and won’t let it happen again. Next year, be prepared 
with a checking account at our bank. Each month, you receive not only all your cancelled 
checks, but a detailed itemized statement covering each check, date written and each 
deposit. Plus we’re always ready to give you any special assistance you need at no extra 
charge. Open your checking account with us today!

Checking Account

Would Help..

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK

Member F.D.I.C. • Insured To $40,000 
Knox City, Texas



Fat Stock Show 
Sets New Records

Records continue to fall as 
the 83rd annual South­
western Exposition and Fat 
Stock Show nears its opening 
day, Wednesday, January 
24. The show will end on 
Sunday, February 4, with all 
activities scheduled on Car­
ter Square in Fort Worth.

A record of 14,900 head of 
livestock is expected to be 
exhibited at the exposition 
and the 22 performances of 
the World’s Original Indoor 
Rodeo will feature contests 
for a record 846 cowboy en­
tries vying for over $188,000 
in prize money. Livestock 
premium money totals 
almost $200,000.

“We are pleased to see the 
projected increases in 
livestock show and rodeo en­
tries,’’ said W.R. Watt Jr., 
Stock Show president- 
manager. “This continues a 
trend of recent years where 
we have been fortunate in 
establishing a gain from 
year to year.’’

Special guest entertainer 
at each rodeo performance 
will be Rex Allen Jr., recor­
ding sta r for Warner 
Brothers, and his band the 
Country Travelers. Tickets 
are on sale daily, including

Sunday, from 9 a.m. until 6 
p.m. in the Will Rogers 
Coliseum lobby ticket office.

Watt said good tickets 
remain for many of the 22 
performances, and urged 
rodeo fans to buy their 
tickets early. Performances 
are set at 8 p.m. January 24 
through February 4; 10 a.m. 
Saturday, January 27; and 2 
p.m. January 27 through 
February 4. The two Friday 
nights, two Saturday
matinees and nights and the 
final Sunday night are sold 
out.

“All the reigning world 
champion cowboys are 
among the rodeo entries,’’ 
Watt said. Leading the 
cowboy list is Tom
Ferguson, all around cham­
pion, whose biggest win last 
year was over $12,000 at the 
Fort Worth Rodeo. He com­
petes in calf roping and steer 
wrestling and finished the 
1978 rodeo year with over 
$84,000 in prize money.

Saddle bronc champion 
Joe Marvel, bareback
champ Bruce Ford, bull
riding king Don Gay, calf 
roper champ Roy Cooper 
and steer wrestling tophand 
Byron Walker, as well as

Sharon’s Tips & Topics
By Sharon Book

Assistant County Extension Agent

5SSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSSS86SSSSSS«

PLAN NOW FOR 
CHRISTMAS 1979

Now that Christmas 1978 is 
history, readers should 
begin plans for Christmas 
1979 to save time, money, 
and frustration.

Plan in advance to avoid 
hasty shopping decisions, 
finance charges on credit 
purchases, and crowds of 
seasonal shoppers which 
jam the displays and coun­
ters during the holiday 
season.

Use the following 
suggestions to make the 1979 
holiday season an enjoyable 
time for the whole family;

"Buy Christmas cards, 
supplies and decorations 
during the after-season 
markdowns. Many items 
will be cut in price by 30 to 50 
percent, or more.

-Take advantage of sales 
and specials to buy gifts at 
bargain prices. Retail stores

Use The 
Classifieds

usually follow a time cycle in 
selling certain  items at 
reduced prices.

Keep a list of sizes on hand 
for quick reference when 
shopping for adult gifts.

-U se imagination in 
choosing gifts. Try new 
types of stores and items. 
Instead of one large present, 
consider several small 
related gift items or combine 
items with homemade items.

-Plan to sew, bake, paint 
or make gifts. These gifts 
mean more to the receiver 
than a bought item.

-Instead of buying gifts 
for everyone, consider 
drawing names.

This suggestion is 
especially helpful if the 
group is large.

-Consider giving a very 
special birthday or “other 
occasion’’ gift rather than a 
large gift for Christmas. 
This will schedule gift 
buying throughout the year.

-B udget a realistic 
amount of money for 
Christmas gifts.

Substitute time, effort and 
skills for money.

Dee Picket, “PRCA Rookie 
of the Year,’’ are also on the 
entry list.

Neal Gay of Mesquite will 
serve as rodeo production 
manager with eight rodeo 
stock contractors providing 
rodeo stock this year. Mrs. 
Ellen Backstrom of Wicken- 
burg, Arizona, will return as 
rodeo secretary.

Scheduled to do the chores 
of protecting the bull riding 
contestants are four top 
rodeo clowns. Returning will 
be Tommy Lucia of 
Weatherford, barrel man, 
while Miles Hare of Gordon, 
Nebraska, and Skipper Voss 
of Crosby will be arena 
clowns. New in the group 
will be Bob Romer of 
Canyon.

The livestock show entry 
count posted more than 9,300 
cattle, sheep and swine; 
1,900 horses, and an 
estim ated 3,800 rabbits, 
pigeons and poultry entry.

A sizeable gain was also 
posted in the pen division 
where commercial Hereford 
and Angus females will show 
in pens of 20 and 15 head, 
respectively, prior to auc­
tion. Watt said the buying 
opportunities in the com­
mercial sales are outstan­
ding, with buyers having a 
chance to choose from top 
replacement heifers from 
some of the best known her­
ds in the Southwest.

New departm ents this 
year brought 75 entries of 
Devon breeding cattle and 93 
entries for the National Pin- 
zgauer cattle show. Also, 
some 85 entries are listed in 
the Texas Longhorn Cattle 
sale group.

Watt expressed confidence 
for a well-attended junior 
division program, saying 
that the separation of the 
junior heifer and steer shows 
and the rearrangement of 
show times for junior sheep, 
lambs and barrows should 
be more convenient for 
young exhibitors and present 
a better show to the public.

“Since our show was foun­
ded in 1896, show officials 
have encouraged our young 
e x h ib i to rs  th ro u g h  
e d u c a tio n a l p ro g ra m s , 
higher premiums and more 
competition with a broader 
schedule,’’ the president- 
nianager said.

The annual Stock Show 
Parade is scheduled Friday, 
January  26, at 2 p.m. 
through downtown Fort Wor­
th. Entries are welcome to 
participate. The Parade 
does not allow motorized 
vehicles, in keeping with the 
western heritage of the Stock 
Show.

PAY YOURTlXES
NOW!

Penalty and Interest, Plus 
$1.00 Costs, will be added 

February 1,1979

John A . Sm ith
Tax Assessor-Collector, Knox County, Texas
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T am m y B ro th e r s ,  having trouble with our TV’s

O’Brien Happenings
By CHARLENE BROTHERS

=»«: iMs

I have tried very hard not 
to be unhappy with this 
weather, but it is so hard 
when you cannot get around. 
I’m about ready for some 
pretty sunshine for a while. I 
did not fall any this time, but 
several did and broke bones. 
We hope they are doing fine 
by this time. The last place 
that the ice will melt is on the 
north side of our house, it is 
still slick, maybe by the time 
you read this it will be gone. 
Also it needs to stay pretty 
for some time so the farmers 
can get their cotton out. We 
are saying that we are about 
halfway through, we have 
weighed something over 8700 
bales. There is still a lot of 
cotton in the fields. Several 
bales in ricks, most of the 
modules are being ginned, 
since we got caught up with 
the trailers. People have 
O’Brien gin trailers parked 
all over the county, I saw two 
parked at Rochester on the 
old gin yard there on the 
highway, where the gin is 
closed. Maybe we will get 
them all back when farmers 
start using them again.

The City Council met last 
Thursday night for a regular 
meeting, with all members 
present. The first order of 
business was the swearing-in 
of the new councilman to 
replace Johnny White who 
had moved; this was Clifton 
Duncan. (Now Clifton, your 
phone will ring with com­
plaints.) We still do not know

very much more about when 
they will get to work on the 
water line that will connect 
us in with Miller Creek Dam, 
maybe soon.

Have you ever noticed on 
boxes to be opened, it says 
push in and pull back, sounds 
easy. The other day I got so 
bothered with a box of 
detergent that I thought I 
was going to have to get a 
saw to open it. It would not 
push in with my hand, had to 
get a knife, then it would 
hardly cut open. I’m always 
having trouble with 
something like this, but what 
gets me the worse is 
medicine bottles that you 
have to line up the arrows or 
something of that sort. First 
off I cannot see the arrows 
half of the time, then the top 
is so hard to push off I cannot 
manage that. Guess I’m just 
a weakling, or so dumb I 
cannot understand direc­
tions.

All the college students got 
off to school this week. I for 
one really missed Craig this 
morning, he had been 
working at the gin while he 
was out and on the cold mor­
nings he would start my 
pickup when he left to go to 
work, and it would be warm 
when I got ready to go. This 
morning I had to do it 
myself.

This is one of those weeks 
when I’m late again. Even 
last week with all the ice on 
the ground I made it in on

Monday, was just too busy 
yesterday. Maybe they will 
have time to get this in. 
HERE AND THERE

Mrs. Loretta Hewitt and 
Vicki visited in Snyder with 
Mr. and Mrs. Bert Davis 
during the weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Orval Man­
ning were in Slaton last week 
to attend the funeral for 
Ford Renny, a relative of 
Helen’s sister-in-law. They 
also visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. C.L. Parr and Mr. and 
Mrs. D.M. Pack while they 
were there.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene 
Jones of Wichita Falls 
visited with his mother, Mrs. 
Clyde Jones, during the 
weekend.

Marvin Manning spent the 
weekend in Springtown with 
his children Mr. and Mrs. 
Derwin Lancaster, Cynthia, 
Wendell, and Carla; Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Gibson, Shane 
and Shawna; Mr. and Mrs. 
Tim Ivey and Mr. and Mrs. 
Darvin Altom.

Pearce Manning was in 
Fort Worth to attend the 
funeral for her gran­
dmother. Christie stayed in 
Hamlin with relatives while 
she was gone and Cody 
stayed with his granddaddy, 
Marvin Manning.

(The following is not really 
O’Brien news, but some 
people in California will ap­
preciate reading it, so I’m 
going to add it.)

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Brothers of Knox City, 
formerly of O’Brien, enjoyed 
a party on her third birthday 
Sunday afternoon at her 
home. Those attending were 
Mr. and Mrs. James Albus 
and Mr. and Mrs. J.O. 
Brothers, grandparents; Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarence Herring 
of Rhineland, great- 
grandparents; Jimmy Ray 
Albus, Craig Brothers, 
Gaylynn Burkham, Mary 
Albus, Bill Myers, Charlotte 
Albus, Brenda Albus and 
Keith Rowan, and her paren­
ts, Cindy and Don Brothers. 
She had a ball opening gifts 
and as usual when she had 
opened the last one, she said, 
are there any more?

Some of us have been

again, and think it is from 
the tower. If you have 
trouble like we had back last 
year will you please put 
down the day, date and call 
the mayor or one of the 
councilmen. They are C.H. 
Underwood, mayor, Buster 
Hodges, Butch Stephens, 
Clifton Duncan, Jam es 
Manning and Charlene 
B rothers, councilpeople. 
Now remember that not all 
interference is caused from 
that, so when it is bad 
weather and it acts up, 
probably it is not the tower, 
so do not call. Only when the 
set does like it did last year, 
and I think most of us will 
remember that. Mr. Smith 
said if the tower started 
giving trouble again they 
would check it out.

RUGGED COUNTRY 
RUGGED
Insulated comfort 

for hunting and 
fishing.

Norma’s Leather Express

SHOP MD sm  
JtTU.LSUP’S

A L L *
CONVENIENCE STORES

Hunt-Wesson’s
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G r e a t  P o s s ib i l i t i e s  F o r  Y o u r  H o m e
RE T RE ATA DO- I T - YOURSEL F

Getting away from it all 
need not take you far from 
home, nor.be too expensive.
Using low-cost materials and 
your own ingenuity, you can 
build a private retreat right 
where you live.

An attic or backyard ad­
dition may be just the place, 
or you can put up a separate 
guest house within steps of 
the main house. All it takes 
is advance planning, and the 
energy and skill required to 
do most of the construction 
yourself.

Attic Addition
Almost any attic — even a 

finished one — will provide 
more living space if you add 
a shed dormer. All it in­
volves is cutting away a sec­
tion of the roof and then 
pushing it up and out as 
though it were hinged at the 
ridge line.

Its sides should be sup­
ported by standard 2x4 
framing, which you can 
sheathe with plywood and 
finish with plywood siding.
Studs for inside walls can 
run from the rafters to 
plates nailed to the existing 
joists.

Insulation should be in­
stalled under the roof and 
between the studs of the 
new wall supporting the 
dormer roof.

Naman
ToTFU

LUBBOCK - Jay Naman, a 
cattleman and farm er of 
Waco, was re-elected by a 
large voting majority as 
president of the Texas Far­
mers Union during its an­
nual state convention.

In a race for the post bet­
ween Naman and long-time 
member David Samuelson of 
Coupland, farmers involved 
in the American Agriculture 
Movement attempted un­
successfully to unseat 
Naman who has held the 
position since 1961.

Re-Elected
Presidency

JOINING THE ARMY RESERVE 
W ONT INTERFERE WITH COLLEGE

In the Army Reserve’s Split Training Program, you can 
split basic and advanced individual training into two consecu­
tive summers. You’ll earn full Army pay during the summers 
away plus Reserve pay during the rest of the year. For more 
details, call your local unit. It’s listed in the white pages under 
“U.S. Government”

Samuelson has been an ac­
tivist in the farm protest 
movement.

“I think it’s sighificant,” 
said Naman, “that at the 
same time the election 
returns were being tabulated 
by the elections committee, 
our delegates were over­
whelmingly adopting a 
resolution in support of the 
thousands of farmers who 
will work in Washington this 
year for critical changes in 
farm policy. Our

H O W  T O  
L E A V IN G  
house, or 
and you've

□
T A K E  A V A C A T I O N  W I T H O U T  
H O M E : S im ply  add a room to  your 
a guest house to  yo ur b a c k y a r d ,  

created a hideaway where you can relax.

s
i

If you install a fireplace, side walls may be framed 
you should choose the pre- with standard 2x4 studs and 
fab type that’s safe even plates, and the roof, with 
when there’s no clearance rafters to which you attach 
between it and wood fram- a gypsum board ceiling. Or,

use exposed beams with 
5 /8 ’’ p lyw ood siding as 
sheathing to create a cathe­
dral ceiling.

For more detailed instruc­
tions and many additional 
d o-it-y o u rse lf ideas, get 
your copy of “Great Possi­
bilities for Your Home’’ by 
sending 75^ to cover post­
age and handling to Great 
Possibilities, Dept. NAPS, 
Georgia-Pacific Corp., 900 
S.W. Fifth Avenue, Portland, 
Oregon 97204.

Any o f these easy-to- 
calls for a perimeter founda- complete additions can give 

ply- tion and wood joists covered you a relaxing hideway that 
dif- with a plywood or particle- can add to your peace of 

board floor  system. The mind.

Backyard Addition
At the back o f your ing. Once you’ve framed it 

house, an add-on room has w ith standard dimension 
one wall up even before lumber, you can cover the 
construction starts. Extend interior wall with prefin- 
the ex istin g  roof w ith  ished wall paneling.
2x6 rafters or, for a more a  glass wall on one side 
dramatic effect, with 4x6 or of the room opening onto a 
4x8 lum ber beams that deck will complete a room 
w ill remain exposed. Use designed for indoor-outdoor 
5 /8 ’’-thick textured  ply- living, 
wood siding for a beautiful,
modern ceiling. The Retreat

You may want to cover A guest house b u ilt  
the side walls inside and out around a prefab fireplace, 
with quality plywood siding where you can retreat when 
like that manufactured by you feel like being alone, 
Georgia-Pacific or opt for a 
beau tifu l prefinished 
wood paneling, with a 
ferent texture.

KC Colored 
News-Events

St. Paul were host to the 
‘Lovely Sunset’ Association 
last Wednesday - Friday, 
opening Wednesday night 
with the Moderator Rev. 
F.K. Williams in charge. 
Churches from El Paso, 
Midland, Odessa, Anson, 
Sw eetw ater, A sperm ont 
were present. Meals were 
served about hundred people 
were serve.

I

Ii
I

Sunday School at St. Paul 
had a small attendance, 
Supt. in charge. The lesson 
were taught and reviewed by 
the Supt.

People don’t be afraid that 
you see is the brown stuff is 
the ground, in case you 
forget.

The Church of the Living 
God did not hold Sunday 
School because of the 
weather.

LAST WEEK
St. Paul didn’t have ser­

vice Sunday. First Baptist 
weren’t on the T.V. At least I 
couldn’t get them because of 
God good weather we stayed 
at home in our half warm 
house. But we prayed right 
on.

I wonder what that is out 
there, some says it white 
paint. I wonder how did it get 
there a little boy said some 
men put it on every thing to 
make everything pretty. 
Weren’t that sweet?

Well the Cowboys have 
made the Super bowl. Now if 
they can make it to cham­
pion again this time wont 
that be something?

RTA To Hold 
Meeting Here

The Knox County Retired 
Teachers Association will 
meet at 2:30 p.m. in the Knox 
City Community Center on 
Tuesday, January 23. Hazel 
Smith and Ila Moody are 
directors of the program.

The subject to be 
discussed will be “ Look 
What I Made.’’

Hostesses for the meeting 
will be Mabel Pyeatt, Eruis 
Reid, and Gladys Reed. 
Guests are invited.

A Romantic Name

Scotland  has som e very 
peculiar nam es, and vis­
itors are alw ays making 
fun o f A uchterm uc h t y, 
E cclefechan, Lesmahagow 
and Auchensbuggle.

But Scotland has some very 
beautiful names, too, and one 
of the most romantic is 
Sweetheart Abbey, although 
its real name is New Abbey.

CHANGE OF ADDRESS
If you are presently 

receiving Social Security 
checks and have moved 
recently, it is necessary that 
you report your new address 
to the Social Securitv office.

If the post office has a for­
warding address for you, you 
should contact your nearest 
Social Security office and 
have them change your ad­
dress on their records. By 
doing this, you will prevent 
an unexpected non-receipt of 
your Social Security check. 
The post office will not 
always forward government 
checks. If they do not, then 
your checks would have to be 
returned to the Treasury 
Department. These checks 
would eventually be reissued 
to you, but not until after a 
long delay.

If your checks are being 
sent directly to a bank or 
savings institution, it is also 
very important that you 
change your mailing address 
each time you move. This 
will perm it the Social 
Security Administration to 
send continuing information 
about Social Security to your 
correct address. It will also 
permit the Social Security 
office to get in contact with 
you at once should they need

to speak with you about your 
benefits.

If you have moved recen­
tly or are contemplating a 
move in the near future 
within the Knox County 
area, you should contact the 
Vernon Social Security office 
to update your records. The 
office is located at 1701 
Cumberland and the phone 
number is 817-552-9346.

organization has indicated 
complete harmony with the 
A m erican  A g ric u ltu re  
Movement during their 
business here. And, of cour­
se, our stand for 100% parity 
has been on the books since 
the drafting of that formula 
in 1937.’’

Naman also gave high 
compliments of respect for 
his opponent, saying, “David 
Samuelson has been a per­
sonal friend for over fifteen 
years and his work for Far­
mers Union in Central Texas 
has, in a singular and 
dedicated effort, held the 
organization together in that 
area of the state.’’

Also elected during the 
state convention to attend 
the National Farmers Union 
convention in Kansas City 
the first week in March were 
Charlotte Garner of 
Seminole (Gaines County), 
Cathey Harmon of Happy 
(Swisher), Joe Rankin of 
Ralls (Crosby) and Virgil 
Blakney of Turkey (Hall). 
Rankin, who is current vice 
president and who ran unop­
posed, was also re-elected.

E IG C T R iC m
★  OILFIELD ★ INDUSTRIAL ★ REPAIR 

★  WIRING ★ IRRIGATION ★ COMMERCIAL!

DEPENDABLE INSTALLATIONS

C & C Electric
Willie Collins Knox City 658-3921

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★  
♦

♦
♦

Dance

IN IOWA PARK
Mr. and Mrs. O.C. Poe 

spent the weekend in Iowa 
Park visiting with Mr. and 
Mrs. John R. Peysen and 
Rhondi.

■N 
M
4c 
4c 
4c 
4c 
4c 
4c
★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

- SA T. N IG H T - 'J A N .'2 0  — ^

Kuntry Kings
Benjamin Memorial Building

9:00 to 1:00 $4.00

4c
4c-
4c

4c
4c
4c
4c
4c
4c
4t
4c
4c
4c

V *».

study Club 
Meets Today

The Knox City Study Club 
will hold their regular 
meeting at 2:30 p.m. on 
Thursday, January 18, at the 
Community Center with 
Myrtle White as leader.

Speaker for the meeting 
will be W.R. Baker. 

;>*; Hostesses will be Lillian 
I Logan and Winifred White.

.■'1
EHE Club 7o 
Meet Jan. 22

The Extension Home 
Economics Club will meet at 
the Community Center Mon­
day, January 22, at 7:30 p.m.

Refreshments will be fur­
nished by Sherry Hacker and 
Pearl Eaton. The door prize 
will be furnished by Carolyn 
Sloan.

Card Of Thanks
To all our friends and relatives, may we ex­

press our thanks and appreciation for your 
many kindnesses during the loss of our loved 
one.

The cards, food, flowers, visits and words of 
sympathy meant so much to us. Our special 
thanks to Doctor Howell, the nurses and 
honorary pallbearers.

The Family of 
Theodore Ressel

W E A R E  C O N C E R N E D  
W IT H  Y O U R  H E A L T H

The dispensing of a prescription medicine is much 
more than an ordinary tran^ction. A doctor has 
determined that a specific drug will help a person with 
an illness and he has given careful instructions as to ] 
the name and strength of the drug, the amount to be 
taken, and for how long it should be used.

As your pharmacist, we have translated these 
instructions and from them prepared your medicine. 
Often, we must give you additional information as to 
storing the prescription, possible side effects, possible 
reactions with other products and other cautions.

YOU OR YOUR DOCTOR CAN PHONE US 
when you need a delivery. We will deliver 
promptly without extra charge. A great many 
people rely on us for their health needs. We 
welcome requests for delivery service and charge 
accounts.

RX DELIVERIES AVAILABLE IN KN6X CITY

H-M Jones 
Pharmacy, Inc.

Knox City, Texas Phone 658-3215]

R,.D B  2  B  5  R Q B H R u R a  P j  b 'D  R

Whatever happens
well make if 

together.
This year’s a real puzzler. Anything could happen. But no matter 

what, you can count on us to hang in there with you. Just like we 
have for 51 years.

And when you save with us you’ll earn the highest rates allowed 
by law.

You D eposit 
This Lump Sum  
(Minimum)

For
This
Long

Compounded 
Daily At 
This Rate

Your 
Actual 
Yield Is

$ 5 Osamatic
Prestige
A ccount 5V4% 5.39%

$ 1,000 6mos. 5%% 5.92%
$ 1,000 lyr. 6^% 6.72%
$ 1,000 30 mos. 6%% 6.98%
$ 1,000 4yrs. 7.79%
$ 1,000 6yrs. 7%% 8.06%
$ 1,000 Syrs. 8% a33%
Money 6 mos. V ari[ab le
$ 1 0 , 0 0 0

C a l l  u s  c o l l e c t  f o r  
t h e  w e e k l y  r a t e .

F o r  q u o t e s  o n  d e p o s i t s  o v e r  $100 ,000 , j u s t  g iv e  u s  a  c a l l .
Early withdrawal on savings certificates is subject to reduction to passbook rate 
plus 90 days interest penalty.

OLNEY
SAVINGS

Olney, Seymour, Jackshoro, Bridgeport, Nocona and now Weatherford and Azle.

l b  u s ,  p e o p le  a r e  w o r t h  a  l o t  m o r e  t h a n  m o n e y

FSUC
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KC School News

THE KENNEL
SENIOR CLASS NEWS 
By Terry Curd

Last Thursday night the 
seniors had a class meeting. 
We discussed our upcoming 
senior trip. We voted to go to 
the coast. Doug (the 
president) is going to write 
to some places down on the 
coast.

We also voted to have our 
senior picture plaque, the 
one that hangs in the hall, in 

'Color. Each student has to 
pay $2.50 to have this done.

In English we started on 
our soil conservation essays. 
We also started  on our 
autobiographies.

In Civics we have a test 
Thursday (today) over the 
Constitution. Everyone must 
pass this test to complete 
civics, which a student must

to graduate.
JUNIOR CLASS NEWS 
By Gerri Watson 

The juniors have been 
working hard on their 
themes again this week in 
English III. Last week Mrs. 
Burnett checked over 
bibliography cards for form 
and content.

Monday we turned in our 
outlines. Mrs. Burnett 
checked these for form and 
content too.

One-act play tryouts were 
held Monday night. Results 
will be given next week 
about those actors and ac­
tresses who got parts in 
“Aesop’s Falables.”
BAND NEWS 
By Gerri Watson 

The band is still working 
on UIL contest music. This is

Multiple Dose Baits
By DEENA PATTILLO,
Wildlife Damage Control Specialist

While trapping is a good 
method for eliminating rats 
and should be used in coor­
dination with baiting, the use 
of rodenticides is better for 
controlling large numbers of 
rats.

The proper use of these 
baits is usually unknown by 
the general public and 
several important points 
must be remembered in or­
der to have a successful 
baiting program. These 
points are valid for all cereal 
or pelletized anticoagulant 
ra t baits regardless of 
brand.

The first point to remem­
ber is that none of these baits 
will kill rats overnight or

Hospital
News

Patients Dismissed 
Since January 6,1979

Knox City: Mary Rocha, 
Jaurine Jones, Benita 
Reyes, Louise Finley, Lupe 
Rios, Romain Stubbs, James 
Wallace, Rose Marie Castro, 
Mary Alice Thompson, Clara 
Smith.
Rhineland: S.E. Williamson. 
Truscott: Paul Bullion. 
O’Brien: April Lehmann 
Goree: Mason Harlan. 
Munday: Bernice Shields, 
Lois Beaty, Georgia Toliver 
Benjamin: Juanita Burnett, 
Theodore Ressell.
Goree: L.L. Atkinson. 
Rochester: Mattie Daniel.

Patients In Hospital 
As Of January 13,1979

Knox City: Othella Walker, 
L.F. Fisher, Tom Thomsas, 
Eva Penman, Julian Garcia, 
Zeola Corley, Louise Finley. 
Rochester: Jam es Y ar­
brough, Nena Alvis.
Munday: John McMahon,
S.E. Williamson, Lois 
Trimmier, Florine Wilde, 
Eddy Y. Johnson, Carl 
Hamilton.
Arlington: Wesley Garrison. 
Graham: Andrew Depriest. 
Truscott: Mae Welch.

with one dose. They must be 
eaten repeatedly for at least 
three or four nights before 
death will occur. (2) These 
baits must be used in large 
quantities. The lethal dose 
for a rat is 1/4 to 1/2 pound 
per rat. A minimum of three 
pounds for a home, or ten to 
fifteen pounds for farms, 
must be used. (3) Moisture is 
the enemy of the bait so out­
side usage is usually not 
very successful. When used 
under the house, an empty 
milk carton will make a good 
bait box. (4) Do not pour the 
bait in an open, shallow con­
tainer. A small sack with a 
cupful or two of bait in it will 
help keep dust, moisture, 
and contaimination off the 
bait. A small hole punched 
with a pencil is the only 
opening needed. (5) 
Remember to check the bait 
daily for at least ten days 
and replace all eaten bait as 
necessary.

These baits are made to 
work in a delayed manner 
purposely. They are the least 
hazardous baits on the 
market; the rats never get 
wary of it; and it is very ef­
fective if used properly. 
Remember to follow label 
directions, or contact the 
local Wildlife Damage Con­
trol Specialist, Deena Pat- 
tillo, at 767-4981.

probably all we will be 
working on until contest time 
in April.

Each student is required to 
play certain scales for UIL 
music for Mr. Steckler after 
school by a set date.
EIGHT IS ENOUGH -I- TWO? 
By Jan Burt

Here we are again with a 
new recruit. Amber Ashcraft 
joined after the Christmas 
holidays. Welcome back. 
Amber.

The choir has started  
working on some popular 
songs just for fun. If anyone 
would like to come join us, 
come on!
FHA NEWS 
By Tammie Helton

The persons working on 
level three encounter had a 
meeting Thursday, January 
11. The members present 
were Gerri Watson, Kelly 
Watson, Angelia Reid, and 
Tammie Helton. Mrs. 
Newton and Mrs. Reid were 
also present. Those who 
finish the third level of en­
counter will be presented 
with a red rose and a pen­
dant at the Area meeting in 
Abilene next March.

STREAMS IN 
DESERT PLACES
By OZELLE STEPHEN,S

WINTER 
DRIVING TIPS
If you’re like most people, 

you probably don’t realize 
how cold weather can affect 
the performance of your 
tires.

Every time the temperature 
drops 10 degrees, your tires 
lose a pound of air pressure, 
and underinflation causes 
dangerous excess wear. Un­
derinflation can also induce 
tire failure. Road checks re­
veal that at least one out of 
four cars is driving on seri­
ously underinflated tires—4 
or more psi below the vehicle 
manufacturer’s recommenda­
tion. Check your tire pressure 
even more often in winter 
than you do the^rest of the 
year—at the very least, once a 
month.

Another thing to check is 
your tire’s “footprint’’—the 
flattened section where the 
tread meets the road. It can 
be easy to see in snow, dirt or 
mud. When that footprint is 
worn sm ooth—down to 
1/16th of an inch or less 
tread depth, your tire is dan­
gerous. Nearly 90 percent of 
tire trouble happens in the 
last 10 percent of tread wear.

Facts from a pro on driving to survive.
Q: During the recent ice storms I noticed 
highway crews often put sand or gravel on 
freeway overpasses, but not on the ground 
level stretches of highway. Why?—N.B., 
Waco

A: It’s a matter of priorities. Overpasses and bridges 
get colder and freeze faster because the air is cooling 
them on both sides. They can freeze even when the 
rest of the highway (partially insulated by the ground 
beneath) remains unfrozen.

Icy roads are rare in much of Texas and motorists 
lack experience with that kind of hazard. Always 
slow your speed in freezing weather, even without 
other traffic on the road. Remember, your tires don’t 
have much traction on that slippery surface. Be 
especially cautious on bridges, curves and hills.

Q: Is a wet road more slippery the colder it 
gets?—B.R., Houston

A: No. Conditions can be most dangerous Just at 32 
degrees, when unfrozen water may be found on top 
of a layer of ice. You simply must reduce your travel­
ling speed in such weather. Also, avoid sudden brak­
ing or steering movements; they can trigger a skid. If 
you do slip into a skid, don’t slam on the brakes; 
you’ll only make things worse. Let up on the gas and 
steer into the skid until you regain control.

Q: Obviously the faster you are going when 
you have a wreck, the more dangerous it is. 
But are there statistics which show how much 
more so?—R.M., San Marcos.

A: Plenty. The probability of a fatility in a crash 
roughly doubles as travelling speed increases from 45 
to 60 mph, and doubles again as speed increases to 
70 mph. They didn’t just pull the 55 mph speed limit 
out of a hat. In 1974, the first year of 55 mph, na­
tional highway deaths dropped by 9,393.

If you have a question on driving, send it to:
Texas Office of Traffic Safety 
P.O. Box 1165 1
Austin, Texas 78767

Jesus said, “I am the Way, 
the Truth, and the Life: no 
man cometh to the Father, 
but by me.’’ (John 14:6)

God has a message for 
those who desire and need 
His miraculous blessings 
and who want to glorify Him 
in their lives. His promised 
blessings are forgiveness of 
sins, relief of burdens, 
solutions of problems, and 
healing for diseases.

The key to His miracles is 
simple faith that Christ 
meant what he said. It is to 
believe, like a child, that God 
says is what He says He is. 
You are what His word says 
you are. God will do what He 
says he will do. You must 
give the word of God the 
same place you would give 
Christ if He were physically 
in your presence. His words 
talk to you, and tell you the 
same thing He would tell you 
if He spoke to you audibly. 
Trust Him; He is the 
greatest friend you can ever 
have, every hour of your life.

Knox City, Texas, Thursday, January 18,1979

Boyd’s 
Welding 
Service

Backhoe Service 
Available 

24 HR. SERVICE

Shelton Boyd 
(817) 658-3639

Page Five

C u s t o m  H o m e s
By

DA VE OXFORD

FREE ESTIMATES
(817) 454-3641 BENJAMIN

NOTICE
Unpaid City Taxes For 1978 

Become Delinquent 
AFTER

January 31,1978 
Avoid Penalty And Interest By 

Paying Your Tax Before 
The Above Date

City of Knox City
HOGE VISITORS

Recent visitors in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. C.C. 
Hoge were Mr. and Mrs. 
David Hoge of Nacogdoches, 
Mrs. Sue McLaren, Danny 
and Sue Ann of Temple and 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hoge and 
Ann of Seymour.

CURRY CHICKEN
1 can (10-3/4 oz.) con­

densed cream of 
chicken soup

1 medium apple, chopped 
1/4 cup seedless raisins
3/4 cup milk

2 tsp. curry powder
9 pieces Original Recipe 

Kentucky Fried 
Chicken

Whip up something exotic 
for special guests—Curry
Chicken. Two delectable dif­
ferences make this dish so 
extraordinary: the creamy
w hite sauce combining 
apples, raisins and tantalizing 
sp ices; and the main in­
gredient — Original Recipe 
Kentucky Fried Chicken. The 
entree is a favorite of Colonel 
Sanders, and a sure-winner on 
your table too!

In medium bowl, combine 
all in g r e d ie n ts , except 
chicken. Place chicken in 
single layer in 8“ x 12“ 
baking dish. Cover chicken 
with sauce. Bake, covered, in 
preheated 350° F. oven for 
30 minutes. Remove cover. 
Continue baking, uncovered, 
for  30  m in u tes  l o n g e r .  
Serves 6.

Fligidaire Jet Cone Washers.
Eveiy laundry day, you’ll be proud of the 
way they get your 
clothes clean.

k .

Rugged Dependability: It’s an 
integral part of every Frigidaire 
Heavy Duty Washer.
Wash a Full 18-lb. Load or just a 
few pieces, with just the right 
amount of water.
AH Frigidaire Jet Cone Washers
have an exclusive (Jp-and-Down 
Agitator Action. It gets clothes 
down to the bottom of the tub, 
where Cleaning Power is Greatest, 
an average of 9 times per regular 
Wash Cycle.

Frigidaire Automatic Diyers. 
They offer care for today's 
fabrics, backed by the 
59-year Frigidaire tradition 
of craftsmanship.
Every Frigidaire Dryer offers you 
the Capacity to Help Save Energy:
A Full 18-lb. Capacity that lets 
you Dry One Big Load, instead of 
Several Energy-Wasting Smaller Loads.
Frigidaire Dryers know when to 
take the Heat off -  to Save you 
more than just Energy.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A Member o( The Central and South West System

Quoli ficd Factory-Trained Servicemen Of fer You Tĥ  Finest In Appliance Service.

Lowrey’s

LADIES’ SPORTSWEAR 
DRESSES -  COATS
NOW 1 /2  PRICE

MEN’S FASHION JEANS

By Levi’s, Wrangler 
& Sedgefield

1 /2  Price Plus °°

HAGGAR SLACKS 
Vi Price Plus °°
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News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home
By EDNA EUBANK

J
Harvey Reynolds conduc­

ted Sunday School at the 
care home after the regulars 
canceled out. We appreciate 
Harvey’s doing this and the 
old folks did too. We had no 
church because of the 
weather.

Mr. Benson enjoyed visits 
from his wife and his son 
Vernon of Benjamin.

Mr. Roberts loved having 
his granddaughter, her 
husband and baby to see 
him.

Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Hollis 
made it in over the icy roads 
to see her mother Mrs.

StenholmTo
Introduce
Legislation

Congressman Charles W. 
Stenholm announced recen­
tly that one of his first ac­
tions in the 96th Congress 
was to introduce legislation 
to extend the so-called 
“Burleson Amendment’’ to 
the Social Security Act, 
which expired December 31, 
1978. The current law ex­
pired when the 95th 
Congress, in its final days, 
failed to conclude action on 
the Medicare Amendment 
legislation which contained a 
provision to make per­
manent the Burleson Amen­
dment, originally designed 
to aid rural hospitals in 
m e e tin g  M e d ic a re  
requirements for nursing 
staff.

Congressman Stenholm 
says he will push for early 
passage of this legislation 
which he feels is “vital to 
rural area hospitals.’’ The 
newly-elected congressman 
added that he hopes to con­
tinue the leadership of his 
precedessor in the area of 
rural health care.

Chandler.
Mrs. Pray welcomed her 

daughter, Betty Williams.
Blanche Thomas was hap­

py to see Mr. Thomas.
Mrs. Gillentine enjoyed 

having her daughter, Lois 
Golden of Benjamin.

Mrs. Berry hill welcomed 
Jean Thomas.

Mrs. Kendrick had as her 
guests Vernon Benson, Edith 
West. Mrs. Hall. Mrs. 
Gideon, Oleta Welch, Lois 
Golden, and Earlene Mein- 
zer.

Mrs. Elmo Stephens and 
little son of Plainview helped 
Mr. Carney celebrate his 
birthday.

Kelton enjoyed seeing his 
guests write in his book. 
They were: Mother and dad­
dy, Kate Wheeler and Lilly 
Washington.

Thomas Posey paid his 
mother a visit.

Mamie Benton was happy 
to see her brother, Weldon 
LaDuke.

Lloyd Gillentine of Fort 
Worth came to see his 
mother, Cora Gillentine.

Nelson Suter of Old Glory 
made his dad happy by 
calling on him.

Mr. Box’s daughter of 
Crowell braved the elements 
to come to see him.

Mae Flowers enjoyed 
visits from Travis Boyd and 
John Ed Helms.

Mrs. Clark and Waynell 
were surprised to see Nina 
Lee Batey and Mrs. Beatrice 
Batey of San Angelo. Nina 
Lee is a daughter of Mrs. 
Clark and Mrs. Batey is Nina 
Lee’s mother-in-law.

Mrs. Williamson enjoyed 
having Clifford and Blanche 
Elliott.

Lou Sikes played bingo 
with the residents one night. 
That made them very happy. 
Thanks, Lou!

Ressel Rites 
Held Saturday

Funeral services for 
Theodore R. Ressel, 65, of 
Benjamin, were held at 2:30 

,p.m. Saturday at the First 
Christian Church in Ben­
jam in with Terry Car­
twright, Church of Christ 
minister of Lubbock, and 
Weldon Walling, Church of 
Christ minister of Benjamin, 
o f f ic ia t in g .  M aso n ic  
graveside rites were held by 
the Orient Masonic Lodge 
No.905 of Knox City.

Mr. Ressel died at 8:35 
a.m. Friday, January 12, 
in the Knox County Hospital 
after a lengthy illness. 
Burial was in the Benjamin 
Cemetery with Smith 
Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements.

Mr. Ressel was born on 
May 4, 1913 in Petrolia. He 
married Ruth Castlemen on 
October 29, 1932 in Knox 
City. He retired in 1975 as the 
Knox County maintenance 
foreman for the State of 
Texas Department of High­
ways and Public Transpor­
tation. Mr. Ressel was a 
member of the Masonic 
Lodge and the Church of 
Christ.

Survivors include his wife, 
Ruth of Benjamin; two sons, 
V.T. of Clovis, New Mexico 
and Ronnie of Dickens; two 
daughters, Mrs. Jo Car­
twright of Benjamin and 
Mrs. Katherine New of 
Seguin; one sister, Mrs. Mae 
Nichols of Littlefield; one 
brother, Joe Ressel of San 
Antonio; and six gran­
dchildren.

Pallbearers were Hester 
Hall, Ezell Reynolds, Leon 
Bivins, Jim  P ra tt, Pate 
Meinzer and Bud Conner. 
Honorary pallbearers were 
employees of the Highway 
Department and members of 
the Masonic Lodge.

Use The 
Classifieds

Who Really Runs 
A Newspaper?

THE PUBLISHER 
.Leaps tall buildings in a 
single bound;
Is more powerful than a 
locomotive;
Is faster than a speeding 
bullet.
Walks on water.
Talks with God.

THE EDITOR
Leaps short buildings in a 
single bound.
Is more powerful than a 
switch engine.
Is just as fast as a speeding 
bullet.
Walks on water if the sea is 
calm.
Talks with God if special 
request is approved.

THE ASSISTANT EDITOR 
Leaps short buildings with a 
running start and favorable 
winds;
Is almost as powerful as a 
switch engine;
Is faster than a speeding BB, 
Walks on water on an indoor 
swimming pool.
Is occasionally addressed by 
God.

REPORTER
Makes high marks on wall 
when trying to leap 
buildings.
Is run over by a locomotive. 
Can fire a speeding bullet. 
Swims well.
Talks to animals.

TYPESETTER 
Runs into buildings. 
Recognizes locomotives two 
out of three times.
Is not issued ammunition. 
Can stay afloat with a life­
jacket.
Talks to walls.

PROOFREADER
Lifts buildings and walks 
under them.
Kicks locomotives off the 
tracks.
Catches speeding bullets in 
teeth and eats them.
Freezes water with a single 
glance.
Mumbles to self.

Why Settle For Less 
Than The Maximum 

Interest
You Can Earn On Your 

Savings Account!
A N N U A L  RATES 

8 . 0 0 %

7.75%

7.50%

6.75%

6.50%

5.75%

5.25%

8"Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

6-Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

4-Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

2V2-Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

1 -Yr. Cert. 
$1,000.00 Min.

90-Day Cert. 
$500.00 Min.

Passbook Account 
Open For $5.00 or More

♦A N N U A L YIELDS

8.33%

8.06%

7.79%

6.98%

6.72%

5.92%

5.39%

•IF INTEREST IS LEFT TO COMPOUND CONTINUOUSLY FOR 12 MONTHS
A SUBSTANTIAL INTEREST PENALTY IS REQUIRED FOR EARLY WITHDRAWAL FROM CERTIFICATES

4 5  Y e a r s  Y o u n g
$64.2 Million Strong

THE NEW  MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATE
•  M inim um  deposit is $ 10 ,00 0
•  Earns .2 5 %  more than the current treasury bills*
•  Term is 26 weeks
•  Interest is com pounded d a ily
•  Funds are  insured to $ 40 ,00 0  by the F .S .L .I.C .
•  F ed era l regulations require  a substantial penalty for 

e a rly  w ithdraw als from certificate accounts
*  Ask about the current rates on the "Money Market Certificate"

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS A N D  
LO A N  ASSN. OF STAM FORD

F S U C
Solwip 6 Uw 6»sww«ee Cwp

«»wt Intwod to 640.000-

Home Office;
122 W McHarg 
P. O. Box 51 1 
Stamford, Texas 79553

Branch Office;
No. 3 Avenue D 
P. O Box 444 
Haskell, Texas 79521 
Phone 864-31 79

Division Office:
Quanah Federal Savings 

end Loan
3-13 i n St.

79252

M arch o f D im es H as Im pact
on L ives ofP oster C hild and Fam ily

Like most youngsters her age. 
eight-year-old Melanie Brocking- 
ton of Lancaster. Tex., changes 
her mind from day to day about 
what she wants to be when she 
grows lip. Her choices vary from 
cake decorator to piano player.

But that’s a decision Melanie 
can postpone for a while. Right 
now most of her time and energy 
is occupied with being 1979 Na­
tional Poster Child for the March 
of Dimes.

Melanie, who was born with 
open spine, is a victim of this coun­
try’s most serious child health 
problem—birth defects. As Na­
tional Poster Child she represents 
more than a quarter-million Amer­
icans who are born each year with 
physical or mental handicaps. 

Birth Defects Prevention
The March of Dimes is trying 

to do something about this tragedy 
by channeling its funds and ener­
gies into birth defects prevention. 
A program which it supports at 
the University of Texas Southwest 
Medical Center in Dallas is one 
that provides genetic services.

Two years ago. when Melanie’s 
mother became pregnant again, 
the family sought help there.

They learned that spina bifida, 
or open spine, is believed to 
result from a combination of ge­
netic and environmental factors. 
The chance of its recurring in a 
family with one affected child is 
generally about five per cent for 
each subsequent birth.

Even knowing these facts, the 
Brockingtons were understand­
ably concerned about the health

WHENEVER BABY BROTHER Trent gets on his high horse, eight-year-old 
Melanie is always nearby to lend a helping hand.

of their expected second child. So. 
during her fourth month of preg­
nancy, Mrs. Brockington had am­
niocentesis, which is a sampling 
of the fluid surrounding the baby, 
for laboratory analysis. Results in­
dicated that the unborn baby did 
not have open spine.

This reassurance allayed the 
family’s fears. Trent Brockington. 
who was born a healthy infant, is 
now an active toddler.

Although she is paralyzed from 
the waist down. Melanie doesn’t 
have any trouble keeping up with 
her younger brother. She walks

with the aid of braces and crutches 
and even dances. When she’s not 
boogying to the beat. Melanie re­
laxes by just listening to recĉ rds. 
She’s a Shaun Cassidy fan.

Melanie is in the third grade at 
West Main Elementary School in 
Lancaster. She looks forward to 
music and art classes and she also 
enjoys mathematics.

Her father. Tom, is regional 
credit manager for the Western 
Company of North America in 
Fort Worth. Her mother. Ann. is 
a court reporter for the Dallas 
County Probate Court.

L A N E  A P P A R E L ’S SEMI-ANNDAL S T O C K  R E D U C T IO N

THE SAVINGS YOU’VE BEEN WAITING FOR!
Famous Brands. Known Brands.

Entire stock of high quality 
merchandise at Terrific Savings to 
You! UP TO 50% AND MORE 
Smart shoppers go where all prices 
are always low! Our store wide low 
prices add up to bigger and better 
savings. STARTS THURSDAY.

Item s lis ted  in  th is  ad a re  ju s t a few  exam ples of the hundreds o f item s to sell out a t  once.

Giant Clearance On Year Around Fall 
and New Spring Items

S A L E

•Strictly Cash 
•Alterations Extra 
•All Sales Final 
•No Exchanges 
•No Approvals 
•No Refunds 
•No Lay-Aways 
•Gift Wrap Extra

T SHIRTS 
Tank Tops, Fancy T 
Shirts, and Rugby knits 
to wear with Jeans. The 
most unusal patterns, 
cuts, and trims for a 
whole new look,

ALL >/i PRICE

DRESS k  SPORT 
SHIRTS

Entire Stock-Our finest 
in long sleeve shirts. 
Best of colors and styles. 
Career Gub and Arrow. 
Save a lot.

20% OFF

FANCY SHIRTS
Quina nylon and 
ultrassa styled for to­
day’s easy going look. 
Long and short sleeve. 
Great Selection. $18.00 
value.

SALE PRICES S6.00

’̂ KNiT CASUAL su rrs^
Beautiful styles—Dress 
or Western constructed 
or unconstructed.
Famous Brands. You 
will want to look at 
thesel From Vi UtVy Off 

Regular Price

SPORT COATS
The greatest sport coat 
sale, we have ever had. 
Vi of our large stock of 
beautiful patterns and 
solids will be in this lot. 
Can you believe?

>/2 REG. PRICE

DRESS TIES
Famous name of 

Wemblon, all polyester, 
washable. Assorted 
colors and patterns.

Reg. $7.50.
SALE PRICED $2.50

JEANS 
The big three brands, 
solids, patterns, and 
checks. Slim, Regualr, 
Straight, or Flare Legs. 
Penty of long lengths. 
Stock up. Values to 

.$15.50. 
.SALEPRICKDM.AAi

SWEATERS
Slip overs-Button 
zipper front-V or crew 
neck-western or dress. 
All kinds & colors. 
Entire stock.

20% OFF

WESTERN SUITS
A selection of our entire 
stock of western suits 
will be red tagged for 
special savings. Beauti­
ful!

20 to 50% OFF

WESTERN SHIRTS
Large lot long sleeve in 
H-C and Wrangler. Pas­
tel solids and beautiful 
patterns.

20% OFF

DRESS SUITS 
Red Tags. This is the 
time to lay in fresh life to 
your wardrobe. All new 
and lively styles k  
colors. Reg. v^ues to 
$185.00.

As low M $52,50

TURTLE NECK SHIRTS 
Stretch knit turtle neck 
shirts in solids or 
striped. Perfect for the 
cold winter days ahead. 

y> PRICE

Serving H askell ahopping center w ith undisputed  quality  a t a g rea t savings you will w ant to tak e  advan tage  of. (C ut prices 
to the bone!) W e have gone through  the store and  have com pletely  d isregarded  original costs. W hatever you need in the 
way of m en’s appare l, you can buy cheaper a t Lane's during  the  Semi-Annual Closeout Sale. Be here early!

JACKETS
Entire stock of med. 
weight jackets. Deer 
Suede, split cow hide, 
vynal & cord all greatly 
reduced. Stock up now 
& save.

20 to 50% off

CLOSEOUT 
Golf shirts in solids and 
patterns. Three button 
pull over. Gosing them 
out.

e n t ir e  STOCK 
20% OFF

JEANS
Three <acks perma- 
press jeans in lots of 
colors. Solids and 

patterns. Great for 
school.

ALL 20% OFF

NOCONA
Bullhide 79.95 59.
Elk Skin 69.95 48.
Tan Calf 68.95 49.
B e. Grain 68.00 54.

AND MORE

DENIM JEANS
Wrangler irregulars. All 
sizes. No Fault material. 
Great buys on this truck 
load of denim.

1 Pair $9.99 
3 Pair $27.00

FELT HATS
Entire stock of dress or 
western-all colors, sizes 
& styles.

20% OFF

BOOT GRAB BAG
Ladies & Mens exotic, 
rugged and exciting 
leathers and styles. 
Your not going to 
believe these prices. 
YOUR CHOICE $44.00

SPECIAL
Bl. boots
Goldenbrown, dark 
brown, and gray. A real 
buy for back to school. 
Reg. 69.95
$38.95 OR 2 PAIR FOR 

$78.00

CLOSE OUT SHOES 
Our large stock of 
Florsheim & Nunn Bush 
shoes all on sale. Patent 
or natural leathers.

ALL 20% OFF

SPORT SHIRTS
1 table sport shirts in 
knit, velour, or flannel 
jersey. Arrow & Career 
Club. The very best. $24 
values 

SALE PRICED $11.00

Boots For younguU’a 
(Ladies Wear’em) Tony 

sma & Acme from 
sizes 8‘/i-13'/i & 1-6. 
Great tough leathers for 
school.

ALLVa PRICE

ACME 
Tan Calf 49.9S 26. 
Smoke Bull 49.95 32. 
Dingo 59.95 35. 
Tri-Ade 55.95 38. 

GREAT BUYS

JUMPSUITS
Knit, Poly-cotton blend, 
and the denim look. 
Wide selection of sizes 
& colors. Great for 
everyday wear.

ALL 20% OFF

CLOSE OUT SHOES 
Large bin just selected 
from our regular stock. 
Hundreds of pairs in 
Florsheim k  Nunn 
Bush. Latest styles. 

y> PRICE

TONY LAMA 
Nat. Cow 77.95 52.
Camel 
Camel 
Cap Toe 
Liz

89.95 64.
89.95 • 64.
79.95 S8. 

135.00 88.
MORE

THE FIRST THREE 
DAYS OF THE SALE 
THE ENTIRE $120,000. 
STOCK OF BOOTS 
W nX BE REDUCED 

10toS6%OFF

lANE APPAREL IN HASKEU



Four Critical Areas 
Discussed At Meeting

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS Page Seven
' Knox City, Texas, Thursday, January 18,1979

LUBBOCK - Inflation, 
energy, transportation, and 
representation are four 
critical areas that must be 
dealt with on behalf of 
agriculture, according to a 
national farmer spokesman.

Speaking to the opening 
session of the Texas Far­
mers Union state convention 
last week, Stanley Moore, 
president of the North 
Dakota Farmers Union and 
a member of the executive 
committee of National Far­
mers Union, said inflation 
is already causing rationing 
of basic necessities in the 
United States.

“Because of inflation, we 
are starting to ration energy 
by price. Even food is being 
rationed by price, though 
farmers aren’t getting much 
of that price. Land 
availability is being rationed 
by price. High interest costs 
are rationing cap ita l,” 
declared Moore.

“We all have a mutual 
obligation to face up to the 
creeping effects of inflation 
and try to meet the 
guidelines set forth by our 
national government. If we 
don’t, rationing as a national 
policy is an inevitability.”

The availability of energy 
is critical to the future of 
farming, noted Moore, 
“ ...and we must develop 
programs to help deal with 
the energy supply situation 
from the farm er stan­
dpoint.” He suggested that 
even some of the cooperative

energy programs initiated 
on behalf of rural America 
are moving in directions that 
may not be in the best in­
terest of farmers.

As new trade markets 
open for agricultural 
products, transporta tion  
becomes more and more of a 
critical concern for farmers, 
pointed out Moore. “If we 
are to develop new markets 
in this world, we have to 
revamp, reorient and shape 
up our transportation 
system ,” he said. “ If a 
major new market did open 
to us, w€ wouldn’t be able to 
supply it because of our 
inadequate transportation 
system.”

Moore suggested railroad 
transportation is a basic 
need to agriculture, adding 
“ It is energy-efficient as 
well.”

M ea n in g fu l f a rm e r  
rep resen ta tio n  becomes 
more and more important to 
farmers as those farmers 
make up a smaller share of 
the U.S. population, said 
Moore, whose North Dakota 
Farm ers Union with its 
35,000 members is by far the 
largest farm organization in 
that state, adding “Even if 
we had every single farmer 
involved in our state, we 
wouldn’t have a completely 
meaningful impact on the 
national level. What is 
needed is the participation of 
many farmers in every state 
in organizations with com-

Employers 
W-2 Forms

Employers must now file 
Forms W-2 and W-2P with 
the Social Security Ad­
ministration, and not with 
the Internal Revenue Ser­
vice, the IRS said. Deadline 
for filing these forms is by 
February 28,1979.

Previously, Form W-2, 
“ Annual Wage and Tax 
S tatem ent,’* and W-2P, 
“Statement for Recipients of 
Periodic Annuities, Pen­
sions, Retired Pay or IRA 
Payments,” were filed with 
the IRS. The 1978 W-2 and W- 
2P are considerably dif­
ferent than the 1977 W-2 and 
W-2P. It is important that 
the proper tax year W-2 and 
W-2P are used, the IRS said.

Under the new procedure, 
the forms will be processed 
by the SSA, which will then 
furnish the IRS with all data 
(including income tax data) 
on the forms.

The change should reduce 
paperwork for employers 
because the forms will in­
clude Social Security 
coverage information as

Must File 
With SSA
well as employee earnings 
information, with com­
putations for quarterly wage 
coverage being determined 
on an annual basis, accor­
ding to the IRS.

Also as part of this new 
Combined Annual Wage 
Reporting System, the IRS 
said, employers may report 
wage and tax information on 
paper, magnetic tape, or a 
variety of magnetic media. 
For reporting to SSA, em­
ployers must remember to 
attach Form W-3, “Tran­
smittal of Income and Tax 
Statements,” with Copies A 
of Forms W-2 and W-2P.

The IRS emphasized that 
employers should use the 
pre-addressed labels sent to 
them. The labels are in­
cluded in the mailout of 
Publication 393, “ Federal 
Employment Tax Forms.” 
The labels should be affixed 
to the Form W-3, “Transmit­
tal of Income and Tax 
Statements.”

For additional infor­
mation, IRS Publication 15, 
“Circular E - Employer’s 
Tax Guide,” is available free 
from local IRS offices.
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PLUMBING-HEATING 
AIR-CONDITIONING
Jerry’s Plumbing

^658-3322 207 N. Central Knox City/

A n n o u n c in g . . .
the opening of

Haskell Chiropractic 
Office

J a n u a ry  22
One Ave. B

Two Blocks East of Square 
864-3950 Haskell, Texas
Hours 8 a.m. til 5:30 p.m. Monday thru Friday 

8 a.m. til 12 Noon Saturday

Melvin H. Henexson

mon goals.”
Moore said cooperative in­

stitutions can provide “very 
significant representation” 
to farmers. He noted that 
cooperative institu tions, 
numerous and closely in­
terlocked in North Dakota, 
“have a significant and con­
tinuing impact in North 
Dakota.”

The educational fun con­
cept, where cooperative in­
stitutions help support a 
general farm organization, 
as well as financial support 
from more direct 
cooperative services, par­
ticularly insurance services, 
have been major factors in 
building a meaningful 
cooperative family in North 
Dakota, said Moore.

“But,” he added, “let me 
say to you that it is the in­
dividual fa rm er’s par­
ticipation ... the par­
ticipation in our organization 
of farmers as delegates, as 
board members, as voting 
members ... that is the single 
most important ingredient to 
an effective farmer force.”

Moore also stressed that 
farmers must continue to 
rely on “a partnership with 
government” to achieve 
their needs.

A gricultural research , 
rural electric and telephone 
services, and farm supply 
and m arketing, have 
resulted from the traditional 
farm er partnership with 
government, said Moore, 
noting that government 
farm program s, “ as 
inadequate as they have 
been, have had significant 
economic impact and some 
of us wouldn’t have made it 
without those programs.”

Moore is a member of a 
U.S. government in ter­
national trade advisory 
committee.

V E L V E T - T H E  R O Y A L  FA B R IC  FO R EV ER Y O N E
Smooth, luxurious velvet 

has come a long way since 
the days when it was the 
choice of royalty for court­
ly robes. Velvet has moved 
into the forefront of fall 
and winter fabrics for use in 
everything from evening 
wear to rainwear to casual 
blazers—for men as well as 
women.

Velvets are woven from 
silks, cottons and syn­
thetics, each with its own 
unique look. But various 
types of velvet also need a

special kind of care because 
of the uniqueness of the 
fabric.

The Textile Analysis 
Laboratories of the Inter­
national Fabricare Institute 
(IFI), the association of 
drycleaners and launderers, 
reports that most velvet fab­
rics are easily restored to 
good appearance in dry- 
cleaning using regular pro­
cedures for cleaning and 
stain removal, followed by a 
steaming-brushing technique 
for pile conditioning avail­

able at most professional 
drycleaning establishments. 
They caution, however, that 
you take care of velvet 
garments, since permanent 
distortion can result from 
any pressure on the pile of 
some velvets when they are 
wet or damp.

The royal families had to 
take even greater care than 
we do with their velvets. 
Today we have the ad­
vantage of spot, stain and 
crush-resistant finishes on 
many of our velvet gar­
ments. Velvets can be used 
even in rainwear with the

j_pplication o f  water- 
repellent compounds that 
assure rain protection in 
addition to spot and stain 
resistance.

To help you enjoy the 
most pleasure and the long­
est wear from your velvet 
garments, the experts at IFI 
offer these tips:

• Always check the fab­
ric. Tightly-woven velvets 
are less likely to suffer loss 
of pile during wear. Also 
select garments with fin­
ished seam edges to avoid 
unravelling.

• Never iron velvet, even 
on the wrong side. This will 
flatten the pile. Instead, use 
a hand steamer to remove 
wrinkles. Turn the garment 
inside out and steam from 
the wrong side. Remember 
not to touch the fabric or 
attempt spot removal while 
it is damp. This will distort 
<̂ he pile, and it may be 
impossible to restore it.

Enjoy this season’s velvets 
for many seasons to come 
by treating them gently and 
sharing their care with your 
professional drycleaner.

Summary Statement Of Receipts And Expenditures
Office of the County Treasurer 

For The Quarter October 1 - December 31,1978

Cash Bal. Add Deduct Cash Bal.
10/1/78 Cash Rec. & Checks 12/31/78

Deposited Written

Jury Fund * 2,558.17 $ 6,033.60 $ 2,179.90 $ 6,411.87
Salary Fund 10,689.46 20,178.59 27,858.56 3,009.49
General Fund 3,306.46 78,679.36 41,411.89 40,573.93
Road & Bridge Fund

Precinct No. 1 17,495.56 11,075.01 7,816.79 20,753.78
Precinct No. 2 6,763.15 12,451.58 8,829.42 10,385.31
Precinct No. 3 6,692.06 11,427.91 9,318.13 8,801.84
Precinct No. 4 12,265.67 12,005.23 11,045.44 13,225.46

Lateral Road Fund
Precinct No. 1 5,272.65 1,783.29 3,489.36
Precinct No. 2 5,262.77 5,262.77
Precinct No. 3 5,431.24 5,431.24
Precinct No. 4 5,262.99 5,262.99

Social Security Fund 3,928.83 5,781.50 6,069.30 3,641.03
Public Bldg. Sinking Fund 284.95 2,005.54 2,290.49
Courthouse Building Fund 286.61 286.61
County Fine Tax Fund 2,020.57 1,573.00 1,209.82 2,383.75
County Law Library Fund 706.31 95.00 135.00 666.31
Title VII Program 3,618.12 3,453.64 164.48
Senior Citizens Fund 1,340.32 842.73 963.37 1,219.68
Federal Revenue Fund 49,592.55 21,760.00 8,414.34 62,938.21
TOTAL ALL FUNDS $142,778.44 $183,909.05 $130,488.89 $196,198.60

The above Quarterly Finance Report, which was prepared by Knox County Treasurer J.T. Cypert, was approved by the County 
Commissioners’ Court on this the Eighth day of January, A.D., 1979.
ATTEST:
/s / Gloria L. West /s / H.T. Melton
County Clerk, Knox County County Judge, Knox County, Texas

Check With Us For 
Your First Of The Year Needs
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K N O X  C IT Y
TEXSUN

------------ GRAPEFRUIT
SPECIALS GOOD JUICE

3 ^ S c u ) t e

DOUBLE
S & H GREEN STAMPS

W E D N E S D A Y S
With The Purchase 
Ot S2 50 Or More

THUR.,FRI.,SAT„ 
JAN. 18-19-20

48-oz.
Can

LIMIT 3
/:4 s r(y m c f-

PICNICS
SMOKED

GLADIOLA

FLOUR

C M V T  l U M
GAINES  

2 5 L b .B a g

9 9

SHURFINE
SOUPS

C H I C K E N  N O O D L E  
or V E G E T A B L E

HOT 
LINKS

SKurfine
S H O R TEN IN G

3.POUND CAN

LIMIT 3 
SHURFRESH

FOR

M E L L O R I N E
Assorted 
Flavors 

1/2 Gallon
SMOKED

LB.

For

Shurfresh Sliced

BACON
1-Lb. R  2 9
Pkg

PARKAY
LIGHT SPREAD OLEO

LIMIT 1-WITH 10 .00  
G R O C E R Y  P U R C H A S E

NEWI

F ru it
D rin ks

B LEA C H

79
46-oz.

Can
G A L .
J U G

M IL K  M A T E

2-LB.
TUB 1.19

C H O C O L A T E  F L A V O R E D :
SYRUP

2 0 - O Z .B O T T L E
. 0 - 6 0 '

CHEER
DETERGENT

49 O z .
GIANT SIZE

1  S PAR ER IB S
A F R E S H

l b .

SHURFINE

C R A C K E R S
1-Lb. Box

WOLF

^TTTT
t9 oz.Can

99<

LIS T E R IN E

USTERiNf
j^AsasaaggTMIUJO^
vnoomtact

18-OZ.
BO TTLE

R E G .  2.19

M A A L O X
L IQ U ID

12-O Z .  
R E G .  1.93

6 9

■ox

SKIN CONDITIONING

W O N D R A  L O T IO N
6-oz.Bottle  
Regular 1.45

R e d e e m  Your fTloHed
| l  *S|U4|I

cndSflYE
. . .  lust received in your Pubiishers Ciearing House Envelope

10c on 1 BOUNCE
any size 2 0 - C T .

10c on 1 ZEST
any size

WITHOUT C O U P O N - 1 . 09

BATH SIZE

10c on 1 BIZ
any size

25-OZ.

WITHOUT COUPOH-1. 39

10c on 1 MR. CLEAN
any size

28-02.

WITHOUT COUPON-89C
1 1.29

WITHOUT COUPON-1.39

RED
DELICIOUS

3-LB.  
B A G

APPLES

SUNKIST

LEMONS
ZIPPER SKIN

TANGERINES
LB.

LBS.

TOMATOES
3-PAK
CTN.

WHITE ONIONS
i LB.



M on ey M arket C D ’ s 
O ffe r B oo st In 1979

OLNEY - “The new six- 
month Money Market Cer­
tificates are expected to con­
tinue to be offered at rates 
anticipated to be higher than 
ten percent for a good por­
tion of 1979,” according to 
D.D. McClatchy, president 
and chief executive officer of 
Olney Savings Association.

This exciting news offers 
the Olney Savings customer 
the highest savings rates 
ever. And, at the same time, 
helps prevent a repeat of the 
1974-75 slump in housing 
starts when savings and loan 
associations had little money 
to finance mortgages,” he

explained.
Olney Savings began of­

fering the Money Market 
Certificates in late 1978. 
“ Since that time, we, 
savings and loans, have of­
fered a higher yield of 1/4 of 
a percent point above the 26- 
week Treasury Bills.”

He continued, “For the 
consumer interested in high- 
yield short-term investmen­
ts, the Money Market Cer­
tificate has definite advan­
tages. It’s easy to obtain, 
minimum $10,000. You know 
the rate of return on your in­
vestment in advance. (Rates 
on the Money Market Cer-

Marble Pound Cake 
is elegant dessert

WINSTON-SALEM, N.C. — When company will be calling, plan 
ahead and prepare a Marble Pound Cake made with Milk Mate, a 
chocolate-flavored milk enricher from RJR Foods, Inc._________

MARBLE POUND CAKE
2% cups sifted all-purpose flour
1 ‘/2 cups sugar
2‘/2 teaspoons baking powder
Yi teaspoon salt
% cup milk
1 cup butter or magarine,
1 teaspoon vanilla
4 eggs
!4 cup Milk Mate
Sift flour, sugar, baking powder and salt into large mixing bowl. 

Add milk, butter and vanilla; beat 2 minutes at low speed, scraping 
bowl frequently (batter will be thick). Add eggs and beat 2 minutes 
more at medium speed.

Remove W2 cups batter to small mixing bowl and blend in Milk 
Mate. Pour 2 3 of plain batter into greased and floured 9- or 10-inch 
tube pan or bundt pan; top with chocolate batter. Spoon remaining 
plain batter into pan. Bake in a preheated 350-degree oven for 50 to 
60 minutes or until done. Cool in pan for 20 minutes; remove cake to 
wire rack. Makes one 9- or 10-inch tube cake.

Dallas Man 
Convicted Of 
S.S. Fraud

James H. Harper, Social 
Security branch manager in 
Vernon, announced another 
Supplemental Security In­
come (SSI) and Social 
Security Fraud conviction in 
the Southwest Region.

Harper stated that Leroy 
Williams of Dallas pled 
guilty before U.S. District 
Judge Sarah T. Hughes in 
Dallas to two counts of 
having made false statemen­
ts to the Social Security Ad­
ministration about his em­
ployment and wages in order 
to receive SSI and Social 
Security Benefits to which he 
was not entitled.

Sentencing is scheduled 
for February 2. The 
maximum sentence permit­
ted by law is a $1,000 fine or 
one year in prison, or both, 
on each count.

“We are proud to serve in 
an agency that has a basic 
mission of helping people,” 
Harper said, “but we are 
obligated and determined to 
pay benefits only to those 
who are lawfully entitled to 
them.”

Give To The 
March Of Dimes

t fH n iiH n i £1
Sale Starts Thursday, January 1 8 ,1 9 7 9

Department I

I I I I
I
II 
I
I
II DRESS SHIRTS
-  I DOUBLE KNIT

I PANTS

GRAND OPENING AND

MENS HANGING

SHIRTS
REGULAR $11.98

NOW
$5.99

MENS LONG SLEEVE CASUAL

WRANGLER 
KNIT SHIRTS 

1/2 PRICE

ONE GROl’P

SUITS, LEISURE SUITS 
& SPORTSCOATS

1/2
PRICE

ONE GROUP OF 
MENS LONG SLEEVE

SOME ARROW

I SHIRTS 1/3 OFF

1/2 PRICE

WESTERN & DRESS

FELT HATS

Department
FLANNEL

SHIRT
REGULAR $7.98

NOW $5.98

MENS WORK

CAPS
VALUES UP TO $7.98

NOW ONLY $1.9^
ONE GROUP

WRANGLERS & LEVIS
ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES 

! MENS INSULATED F

I
S  LONG AND SHORT SLEEVEI WESTERN SHIRTS
I  ONE GROUP

I  WINTER COATS 
I  1/3 to 1/2 PRICE

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I
I______
I BOYS A GIRLS

■■ c h i l d r e n s  SHOES
VALUES TO 112.98

I  NOW ONLY $4.99

$2.00 OFF

1/2 PRICE
CARDIGAN &  PULLOVER

MENS SWEATERS 
1/2 PRICE

Department II
DRESS PANTS 

1/2 PRICE
&  BELOW

VALUES TO $11.50 Now $5.75

ONE GROUP LONG SLEEVE KNIT

DONMOOR SHIRTS 
Reduced 

1/3 to 1/2 Off
ONE GROUP BOYS

JEANS 
1/2 PRICE

j BOYS DENIM

I 
I 
I

- i . ’
I

DRESS SHIRTS I

REGULAR t ll .5 0 ...............   NOW 17.67
REGl'LAR $10.50........................... NOW $7.00
REGULAR $9.50.............................NOW $6.33

BOYS DACRON AND COTTON

1/2 PRICE
BOVS

LEISURE SUITS 
1/2 PRICE & BELOW

BARGAIN TABLE
VARIOUS ITEMS

99c
ALL WINTER BUSTER BROWN

CHILDRENS WEAR 
1/3 REDUCTION

Department IV

SOME

1/2 PRICE
{ONE GROUP]

$5.00 OFF

ONE GROUP OF MENS

JEANS
GOOD SIZES

1/2 PRICE
REGULAR $12.98 

NOW $6.99

I 
I 
I I

1/2 PRICE I

I

FIELDCREST

BEDSPREADS 
25% OFF

I  CUP TOWEL SET

■ REGULAR $3.99

NOW $1.99

.J

ONE GROUP

TOWELS
REGULAR 

TOWEL $5.98 

$3.98H.Towel

Washcloth $1.69

ONE GROUP MENS

JEANS
PRE-WASHED STYLE

1/3 OFF

COVERALLS I COVERALLS |j VALUES m
I UP TO $17.98 I

j REDUCTION I NOW $12.98 |

MATERIAL
REMINANT SALE

50c & 99c

SUEDE

FABRIC
60 INCHES WIDE

1/2 PRICE

ONE GROUP

PIECE GOODS 
1/2 PRICE

KNITS, CHALLIS. DOTTED SWISS 
A. TERRICLOTH

REGULAR SALE

*5.98 $2,99
$4.98 $2.49

$1.49
$1.99

Department V

Department VII
ONE GROUP LADIES PERSONALITY | 

CASUAL &  DRESS I
SHOES I

VALUES UP TO $26.98 I
1/2 PRICE j

ONE GROUP T
DR. SCHOLL'S LADIES |

SHOES I
I

$10.99

LADIES BED’S GRASSHOPPER

SHOES

NOW $7.49
BARGAIN TABLE OF

LADIES SHOES 
FROM

$3.99 to $5.00

ONE GROUP OF LADIES

DRESSES

1 1/2 PRICE 
AND BELOW

I  ONE GROUP

■ COORDINATES
BY DONAVAN GALVANlI REDUCED 50% 

I  AND 1/3 OFF

I LADIES DRESS A CASUAL

ONE GROl'P  MENS WESTERN

BOOTS
VALUFJ5 UP TO $49.98

REDUCED $25.98

BARGAIN TABLE OF

MENS SHOES

$8.99 and $10.99
BIG SELECnON UF LADIES

TENNIS SHOES
RAINBOW OF COLORS

NOW ONLY $2.99

COATS
GREATLY
REDUCED

$10 BARGAIN 
RACK OF 
BLOUSES, 
PANTSUITS 

AND DRESSES
ALL JUNIOR___

JEANS AND  
BLOUSES

REDUCED TO MOVE 
FOR NEW SPRING LINES

ALL LADIES

SWEATERS 
1/2 PRICE

SUNNY SOUTH AND DONOVAN GALVANl

BLOUSES & SKIRTS 1/3 OFF

Come and register 
for DOOR PRIZES

$50 DAILY
IN GIFT CERTIFICATES

to be given away
Department

VI
BIGGEST LINGERIE 

SALE EVER
ONE GROUP

Long Gowns, 
Waltz Length, 
Robes, Scuffs

Reduced to Half Price
A

Bargain Tables Of 
Panties, Bras,

Slips and Girdles

Biggest sale ever - everthing must go 
to make room for spring merchandise

I
I
k .

HURST DEPT. STOREMUNDAT, TEXAS
NO REFUNDS 

NO EXCHAN6ES

JOHNSTON VISITORS
Visiting Mr. and Mrs. F.A. 

Johnston and Shane over the 
weekend were their 
children, Jerry  Johnston, 
Kerrie and Sundee of Milsap 
and Mr. and Mrs. John 
McGaughey, Jodie and Bar­
bie of Stamford.

Jerry’s wife, Janice, was 
in Abilene with her mother 
who is ill.
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Employees Should Receive W-2 Forms
Employees who do not the end of January, they

tificates are based upon 
weekly U.S. Treasury Bill 
Auctions in Washington, 
D.C.) and your money is in­
sured up to $40,000 by an 
agency of the U.S. Gover­
nment.”

Olney Savings certificates 
pay from date of deposit to 
date of maturity and require 
a reduction in interest to 
withdraw before maturity.

Olney Savings is a $158 
million dollar savings and 
loan with branch offices in 
Se y mo u r ,  J a c k s b o r o ,  
B r i d g e p o r t ,  Nocona ,  
Weatherford, and Azle. Also, 
Ranger Savings in Ranger, 
Eastland Savings in
Eastland, and E lectra
Savings in E lectra, all 
divisions of Olney Savings.

FROM OHIO
Harvey Reynolds returned 

to Mount Vernon, Ohio, on 
Wednesday of last week af­
ter a visit here with relatives 
and friends. Harvey is a 
senior student at Mount Ver­
non Bible College and will 
graduate May 14 of this year.

Air-Conditioning 
Plumbing 
Healing

LOOK TO

Guinn Sheet Metal & Pluinbing
Residence & Shop Phone 658*3341 Knox City, Texas

receive their Wage and Tax 
Statements by January 31, 
1979, must still file by the tax 
deadline, the Internal 
Revenue Service said.

To avoid delay in mailing 
Wage and Tax Statements, 
employees should furnish his 
or her employer with a 
current address, according 
to IRS. If employees do not
receivo ti-oir by

should contact their em­
ployer first. After February 
15, 1979, they should contact 
their local IRS office. _

Additional Wage and Tax 
Statement information is 
available in the free IRS 
Publication 15, “Circular E - 
Employer’s Tax Guide,” ob­
tained from IRS District of­
fices.

Make sure your 
next loan is easier 
to pay back

A  good loan should be one you 
can manage on your income.

The Federal Land Bank can 
tailor a payment plan to fit your 
income patterns and cash flow. The 
long-term feature of Land Bank loans 
helps keep your payments 
manageable.

At the Land Bank, we want to 
make sure your loan is as easy to 
pay back as it is to get in the first 
place. Stop by and see how we can 
help.

T h e  L a n d  B a n k
The Bank of Generations

FEDERAL LAND BANK 
ASSOCIATION OF HASKELL

JOE HARPER, Manager 
Offices at Haskell, Anson, and Seymour 

Haskell (817) 864-2062; Anson (915) 823-1142
Long-time Loans on Farms and Ranches 

In Haskell, Jones, Baylor, and Knox Counties

/o

on higher yielding savings
ALSO:

____________ T-BILL
SAVINGS 

CERTIFICATES
A Solid Investnient 

for You.
a minimum investment of ^10,000

Now Paying. . .

9 .5 3  %
Effective J a n u a r y  1 1 - 1 8

Haskell National Bank

Daily Saver
Rate

5%
(Compounded Daily)

Yield
5.13%

lyr. 6% 6.14%

V h  yrs. 6V2% 6.67%

4yrs. 71/4% 7.45%
6 yrs. 71/ 2% 7.714%

8 yrs. 7 W o 7.98%

Minimum (Reg. CD’s) $1,000.00

[If interest is left to compound continuously for 12 
months.] A substantial penalty is required for early 
withdrawal from certificates.
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UMUfOODPMCfS/

SIRLOIN STEAK 
PORK STEAK

32-oz.
R e tu r n a b le  6-pah 

B o t t le s

plus deposit

VAN CAMP'S

P O R K  
&  BEANS

GROUND BEEF
SWIFT M

s i z z l e a n
5 0 %  leaner th a n  b a c o n

Pound

Pound

SLAB

BACON BLOCK OR 
SUCED Pound

DEL M O N T E

38 oz. Bfl.
16-OZ.

CANS

n Alpo Dry

D O G  FO O D
25 lb. $ ^ 9 5

WACNER
FRUIT DRINK

32-OZ.
JAR 2 FOR

V6-Oz.
Cans

100

■ 4S#-i

LIBBY’S VIENNA

AUSAGE
4 - O z .
Cons

DEL M O N TE

SPINACH
15-Oz.
Cans

100

DEL MONTE
Etjrly June

PEAS
17-Oz,
Cans

RANCH STYLE

CHIU
WITHOUT BEANS

2 ' ° '  79^ 19 oz

DELTA TOWELS

FRESH GREEK

BELL
PEPPERS EACH

Texas Yams

4/’lEast Texas. 
US #1

RED
DELICIOUS

APPLES

■4 1 isn IN ■

ASST’D.

Jumbo 
Rolls

LYSOL
SPRAY
DISINFECTANT

18 Oz. Size

COMET LIQUID
$119

32 OZ.

DOWNY
FA B R IC  

S O FTEN ER

-H E A L T H  A N D  B IA U
BAYER
Aspirin 

100 ct. btl.
HEAP & SHOULDERS

Shampoo
7oz. tube

98

1.39
Frozen Foods

M O R TO N 'S  FR O ZEN

HONEY BUNS

SINE-AID 24ct.

Banauet

9 0Z.
PKG.________ _____

FRoimsni
CHICKIN
249

29 Oz

WITH EACH EtLLEO OUGUdflBBr
discount booklet ®


