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Bobby Tankersley Killed Thursday Night

Accident Claims 
Knox City Farmer

A two-car accident in 
Jacksboro Thursday night of 
last week claimed the life of a 
Knox City farmer and injured 
two other men.

Bobby Arron Tankersley, 
39, driver of one of the 
vehicles, was dead on arrival 
at the Jack County Hospital in 
Jacksboro. His father, E.H. 
Tankersley, 58, of O’Brien, 
who was taken to Jack County 
Hospital with a fractured 
cheekbone and shoulder, was 
transferred to Hendrick Me­
morial Hospital in Abilene 
Friday morning where his 
condition was listed as good.

Driver of the other car, 
Danny Sanchez Martinez, 22, 
of Houston received a frac­
tured ankle and facial lacera­
tions. He was listed in fair 
condition in Jack County 
Hospital following the acci­
dent, according to DPS 
trooper Terry Light of 
Mineral Wells.

Another passenger in the 
Tankersley vehicle was 
Danny Stewart of Weinert, 
who was uninjured in the 
incident.

The accident occured at 
approximately 7:20 p.m., 
February 2, on Highway 380.

BOBBY TANKERSLEY

Tankersley’s car was west­
bound when it collided with 
the eastbound vehicle of 
Martinez in the westbound 
lane, according to a DPS 
report.

Investigating the accident 
were J.S. Hensley of the 
Jacksboro Police Department

O'Brien Men Receive 
'Outstanding' Awards

Jerry Johnston, instructor 
in the Haskell-Knox Consor­
tium for the past six years, 
and former O’Brien resident 
Jerry Rowan of Henrietta, 
who is director of the Clay- 
Jack Co-Op Comprehensive 
Education Service, recently 
received awards, respectively, 
as ‘Outstanding Teacher’ and 
‘Outstanding Administrator’ , 
during the ninth annual Mid- 
Winter Conference for Ex­
ceptional Children.

The awards were presented • 
during a luncheon at Moody 
Center, Midwestern State 
University, in Wichita Falls, 
January 28.

Johnston a Knox City High 
School graduate, received the 
BA degree in biology with a 
minor in chemistry from Har- 
din-Simmons University at 
San Marcos in the summers 
of 1973-74 and was guest 
instructor there in the sum­
mers of 1975-76 where he 
taught other teacher trainees.

Johnston taught science 
and coached grade school at 
Old Glory for five years 
before moving to O’Brien 
where he was high school 
principal, coach, and science 
teacher for five years before 
he joined the Haskell-Knox 
Consortium in 1972. Jerry 
now teaches handicapped 
students, ages 14-21, who 
attend from Haskell, Weinert, 
Rule, Rochester, O’Brien, 
and Knox City.

He received a black walnut 
plaque in the shape of Texas 
with the raised letters, CEC, 
and also his name and the 
year engraved on a gold 
plate.

The recipient remarked 
that he would like to give 
credit to his teacher’s aide, 
Johnny Rocha, who made it 
possible for him to receive the 
honor.

Son of Mr. and Mrs. F.A. 
(Ted) Johnston, Jerry is mar­
ried to the former Janice 
Taylor of Byers. They have 
three children, Shane, a jun­
ior student; Kerrie, an 8th 
grader; and Sundee, a third 
grader.

Rowan, whose parents are 
Mrs. Bernice Rowan and the 
late Milton Rowan of O’Brien, 
received his award from the 
National Chapter of Council 
for Exceptional Children for

JERRY JOHNSTON
...outstanding teacher

JERRY ROWAN
...outstanding
administrator.

Region IX. He received the 
award for leadership and 
work in the area of providing 
service for students with spe­
cial needs.

A graduate of Carney 
Schools in O’Brien, Rowan 
received his bachelor’s de­
gree from McMurry College 
in 1965, later receiving his 
master’s from East Texas 
State University in Commerce.

He taught business courses 
at Bonham and O’Donnell 
before moving to Henrietta 
where he is in his fifth year 
with the consortium.

Rowan’s wife, who is the 
former Margaret Mauldin, 
was an anesthetist Baylor 
Hospital in Dallas when they 
married.

The Rowans have a six- 
month-old daughter, Angela 
Marie.

and DPS Trooper James 
Rhoten of Jacksboro.

Funeral services for Bobby 
were held Sunday afternoon 
at two o’clock in the sanc­
tuary of the First Baptist 
Church in Knox City. Officia­
ting was the Rev. John 
Gillispie, church pastor, who 
was assisted by the Rev. Bob 
Cameron, pastor of the 
O’Brien Baptist Church. In­
terment was in the Knox City 
Cemetery with Smith Funeral 
Home in charge of arrange­
ments.

Tankersiey, who was very 
active in the American Agri­
culture Movement, had been 
to a rally in Irving and was 
returning home with his 
father and Stewart when the 
accident occured. Bobby, 
along with his parents, had 
been part of the Knox City 
delegation who travelled to 
Washington, D.C. January 
17-25 to join farmers in 
protest of low farm prices.

Born July 11,1938, in Knox 
County, he graduated from 
Knox City High School in 
1957. Bobby attended 
Hardin-Simmons University 
in Abilene for two years 
where he was a member of 
the Cowboy Band. He mar­
ried the former Judy Ann 
Carrington on February 25, 
1967, in Montague County 
and was a member of the 
First Baptist Church.

Survivors include his wife, 
Judy of Knox City; a son, 
Payton of Knox City; two 
daughters. Shannon E. and 
Jodie Lee, both of the home; 
his parents, E.H. and Martell 
Tankersley of O’Brien; a bro­
ther, Jimmy of Knox City; a 
sister, Mrs. Ken (Lanell) 
Williams of Anson; his ma­
ternal grandmother, Mrs. 
Floy McCurley of Haskell; 
and two grandchildren, Brian 
and Chrystal Tankersley of 
Knox City.

Pallbearers were Cliff 
Swain, Ted Kyle, Charles 
Long, Herbert Bellinghausen, 
Raymond Hollabaugh, and 
Wayne Rowan.

Honorary pallbearers were 
Kenny Spitzer, Larry Flow, 
James Hallford, Bill 
Mcliwain, Fred Dalby, Jerry 
Peek, and Larry Guy.

Farm Week Proclaimed Here Feb. 13-17

American Agriculture 
To Meet Here Monday

ACCEPTING HIS APPOINTMENT as area coordina­
tor for the Stenholm for Congress Campaign in 
Baylor, Haskell, Kent, Knox, Stonewall, and Throck­
morton Counties is Bruce Campbell Jr. of Knox City, 
at left, as he shakes hands with Charles Stenholm, 
candidate for Congress from the 17th Congressional 
District.

Banker Is Stenholm’s 
Regional Coordinator

Charles Stenholm, candi­
date for Congress from the 
17th Congressional District, 
has appointed Bruce B. 
Campbell Jr., of Knox City as 
Regional Coordinator for the

Bobby Roberson 
Draws Opponent

With the approach of the 
February 6 deadline for filing 
for county and state offices, a 
race developed Monday-in 
the commissioner’s race for 
Precinct 2, when a Monday 
man, Boyd Meers, filed with 
County Democratic chairman 
Sam Leaverton. Incumbent is 
Bobby Roberson who an­
nounced several weeks ago.

All other county offices are 
unopposed with the following 
candidates announcing in the 
News:

County Judge, Homer T. 
Melton; County Treasurer, 
J. T. Cypert (re-election); 
District-County Clerk, Gloria 
L. West; Justice of the Peace, 
Precinct 1, Guy Bradley (re- 
election).

Deadline for filing in the 
city and school elections is 
March 1.

City secretary Faye Rails- 
back advised the News office 
Tuesday of this week that 
councilmen Celso Gonzales 
and Charles Auburg have 
filed for re-election.

KC Students Win 
Honors At Show

Knox City 4-H’ers and 
FFA’ers made good showings 
at the Fort Worth Fat Stock 
Show last week, working with 
their swine during the year 
grooming and feeding them 
for the “ big show’ ’ at Fort 
Worth.

In the Junior show David 
Counts placed first with his 
lightweight spot barrow and 
fourth place on his medium 
weight cross. Others placing 
in the Junior shdw were 
Daniel Godsey, tenth on
heavy weight Yorkshire; Cyle' 
Clayton, eighth on light­
weight Yorkshire; Peggy Gu­
tierrez, tenth on lightweight 
Spot; Mike Oliver, sixth on 
mediumweight Yorkshire; 
Rodney Warren, second on 
lightweight Chesterwhite; 
Kyle White, third on heavy­
weight Spot; Gaylynn Burk- 
ham, third on lightweight 
Spot and Kristi White, fourth 
on heavyweight Spot.

Placing in the Open Show 
were Gaylynn Burkham, sixth 
on heavyweight Chesterwhite; 
Kevin White, fourth on me­
diumweight Berkshire; Kyle 
White, fifth on medium- 
weight Spot; Rodney Warren, 
tenth on light weight Cross; 
Shelton Rhodes, third on 
medium weight Spot; Greg 
Oliver, fifth and 11th places 
on his lightweight Yorkshire;

Joseph Godsey, fifth place on 
heavyweight Yorkshire and 
Chuck Hutchinson, sixth on 
mediumweight Duroc.

Other exhibitors were 
Branda Albus, Russel Hacker 
Simone Cobb, and Jay 
Rutherford.

Among those attending the 
show were Mssr. and 
Mmmes. David Albus, Clif­
ford Wayne Hacker, Jimmy 
Albus, Jimmy White, D.l. 
White, J.M. Emerson, Demp 
Emerson, David Counts, Mrs 
Leon Burkham, and Mrs. Bill 
Holcomb.

Plans are being made for 
some of the members to show 
their barrows at the Fat Stock 
Show in Houston the first 
week in March.

Weather
FURNISHED BY PLANT 
MATERIALS CENTER 

4 Miles NW of Knox City

date low high
2-1 33 41
2-2 26 38
2-3 34 43
2-4 32 58
2-5 28 38
2-6, 28 43
2-7 J ; ;̂25 40

Stenholm for Congress Cam­
paign.

Campbell, a banker, has 
lived in the Knox City area for 
25 years and has taken an 
active part in local Democra­
tic Party activities.

Campbell will be organiz­
ing activities for the Stenholm 
campaign in Baylor, Haskell, 
Kent, Knox, Stonewall, and 
Throckmorton Counties. He 
will work closely with county 
coordinators in each of these 
counties.

Local representatives of the 
American Agriculture Move­
ment have scheduled a meet­
ing here next Monday night 
at 7:30 o’clock in the Knox 
City school cafeteria.

Every farmer, every ranch­
er, every landlord, every 
businessman, and every 
other person interested in 
seeing agriculture survive 
should attend this meeting, 
according to the spokesman.

Refreshments will be serv­
ed and Bob Price of Gutherie, 
Oklahoma, will speak.

In recent meetings, it has 
been brought to the attention 
of those present that the 
American Agriculture Move­
ment is not an organization. It 
has no officers or paid em­
ployees although there is 
leadership. The movement 
asks that farm products be 
priced at 100 per cent parity- 
which is not a guaranteed 
income-or subsidy—but a fair 
price for their products.

Each Texas farmer grows 
enough to feed himself and 52 
others. While consumers of­
ten complain about higher 
grocery costs, only $12.50 out 
of every $100 is spent on food 
compared to $23 spent in the 
U.S. in the 1950’s.

At the same time, the

PROCLAMATION

WHEREAS farming is one of mankind’s oldest and most 
important activities, and

WHEREAS farming is vital to the economy of our great 
nation, and

WHEREAS every business within the City of Knox City 
benefits directly from farming,

NOW THEREFORE, I, R. Kenneth Crownover, do hereby 
proclaim the week of February 13, 1978 through February 
17, 1978, as AMERICAN AGRICULTURE WEEK in the 
City of Knox City, Texas.

In official recognition whereof, I hereby affix my signature 
this ninth day of February, 1978.

Is l R. Kenneth Crownover, Mayor 
City of Knox City, Texas

farmer’s share of the market 
basket dollar accounts for 
only 39 per cent of the total 
while others along the food 
chain receive the other 61 per 
cent.

Also in recent meetings, 
farmers and ranchers have 
been urged, “ 1. Don’t buy 
anything unless it is abso­
lutely necessary, 2. Don’t sell 
anything-hold on to your 
products unless you receive 
100 per cent parity, 3. Plant 
only 50 per cent—you can 
make a profit on this but not

BRINGING HOME DIVISION I ratings Saturday at the UIL Solo and Ensemble 
Contest held in Wichita Falls were from left, Stephen Ashcraft, Amber Ashcraft, 
D’Linda Jan Burt, and Shane Johnston. [Photo courtesy of Knox City Schools]

Students Receive Top Ratings
Four Knox City-O’Brien 

High School students receiv­
ed Division I (superior) rat­
ings Saturday, February 4, as 
they competed in the UIL 
Solo-Ensembie Contest at 
Midwestern St'ate University 
in Wichita Falls.

Planning Meeting 
Set For Monday

A Stock Show planning 
meeting will be held at 7:00 
p.m., Monday, February 13, 
in the Knox City Vocational 
Ag. Dept.

The purpose of this meet­
ing will be to review this 
year’s shows and make any 
necessary changes for 1979 
shows.

According to a spokesman, 
all interested persons are 
invited to attend.

.37

Did You Know...
that Jay Eaton, 7316 20th 
Ave. S.E. Apt. 2A, Lacey, 
Washington, 98501 sub­
scribes to The Knox County 
News?

Freshman student Amber 
Ashcraft performed “ Se Tu 
M ’Ami, Se Sospiri’ ’ in Italian 
By Pergolisi, while her bro­
ther, Stephen, sang a number 
entitled “ Linden Lea” , writ­
ten by R. Vaughan Williams. 
Stephen is a senior and their 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Ashcraft.

Performing “ Pleading”  by 
Edward Elgar was D’Linda 
Jan Burt, a junior and the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Melvin A. Lowrey.

Shane Johnston also sang 
“ Linden Lea”  in the compe­
tition and is a junior student. 
His parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Johnston.

According to Mrs. Melvin 
A. Lowrey, who accompanied 
the students at the piano, 
songs were chosen from the 
Prescribed Music List. All 
were Class I solos and the 
division I rating the students 
received meant a superior 
performance for the event 
and the class of participants 
being judged as well as being 
worthy of the distinction of 
being recognized as a first 
place winner

The judge’s critique com­
plimented the soloists on 
their excellent preparation, 
f-nework, and lovely voices.

Soloists expressed their 
appreciation to Mrs. Char­
lotte Griffith, Mrs. Carolyn 
Sloan, and especially Alan 
Steckler for their pointers and 
aid in polishing their num­
bers.

4-H’ers Win At 
Fat Stock Show

Tommy Antilley, County 
Agent, accompanied 4-H 
members to Fort Worth Stock 
Show on Friday, February 3, 
and has released the names 
of winners.

Taking honors were Louis 
Baty, second place on his 
Berkshire; Charlotte Albus 
took first place on her York­
shire and also had reserve 
champion; Billy Carl Benson, 
12th place on Crossbred; 
Rhonda Albus, ninth place on 
Spotted Poland China and 
Michael Albus, third place on 
Crossbred.

100 per cent unless demands 
are met.”

Members of the AAM were 
recently elated by the release 
of a Harris Poll showing that 
the majority of Americans is 
in sympathy with farmers. 
The poll showed 80 per cent of 
the persons polled as 
expressing sympathy while 
13 per cent were not sym­
pathetic.

Also, by five to one, the 
public supports the basic 
demand of the farmers, which 
is to raise the prices of the 
crops they sell so that they 
would be based on 100 per 
cent parity.

Area farmers are in Wash­
ington this week where seve­
ral are testifying before 
House and Senate commit­
tees. Others from here and 
the surrounding area are 
pianning a trip to Washington 
on February 20.

The AAM is aiso urging 
every farmer, every farmer’s 
wife, and every member of a 
farm family to write letters to 
congressmen and represen­
tatives expressing their stand 
on the farm situation. Per­
sons are reminded of the 
impact that all the letters and 
messages had last fall con­
cerning the rurai hospitals’ 
plight.

Farmers’ wives including 
JoAnn Oliver, Patsy Ander­
son, Beth Farmer, Phyllis 
James, Janice Albus, and 
Betty Albus called on most of 
the local merchants Monday 
of this week asking their 
support for the agricuitural 
strike. Reports Tuesday 
morning were that they were 
received ‘beautifuliy’ by 
everyone and stickers were 
displayed in every business 
which was calied on.

Grapevine Trip 
Almost A ‘Sellout’

Only a few seats remain 
unsold for the chartered bus 
trip to the Grapevine Opry on 
Saturday, February 25.

For those who have called 
the office for reservations, 
may we remind you that the 
$20.00 per person fee must be 
turned in to the News office 
by tomorrow (Friday) noon in 
order that we can secure the 
bus and choice seats at the 
Opry.

Knox City Woman 
Injured In Fall

A Knox City woman, Mrs. 
Ethyl Lovelace, suffered, a 
broken hip in a fall at her home 
last Saturday afternoon.

Mrs. Lovelace is a sister of 
Mr.s. Annie Morgan and Har­
vey Freeman.

BULLETIN
Services for Mrs. Ida King, 

who died early Wednesday,
w.ii  i:o ai 2.00 p.m. today 
(fhu'srlayi at First Baptist 
Church.
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SERVICES
IF  YOU NEED FERTILIZER
See Herbert Bellinghausen or 
’call 658-3817 12-18 tfc

SEE YOUR MONUMENTS
before you buy. More than 50 

'designs to choose from. Also 
-<?urb work. J.C. McGee

10-21 tfc

‘ p a in t in g  a n d  a c o u s t i-
*CAL work. All types of con- 
‘ iirete work and plaster. Free 
estimates. Kenneth Burt. 
658-3346. 7-7 tfc

BUDDY TOLSON WELDING 
SERVICE - Portble Welding 
on Farm and Ranch. Will 
build pens and barns. Phone 
454-3231, Benjamin. 3-3 tfc

WATER WELL DRILLING ^
Irrigation. House wells. Stock 
wells. Test holes. Cal! W.P. 
Hise, Haskell, Texas 817 864- 
3727, day or night. 3-3 tfc
STEEL BUILDINGS - Car- 
ports, patio covers, mobile 
home covers. Free estimates. 
Homer Rolston, Benjamin, 
Texas. 817 454-3341. ' 2-2 tfc

FINANCE YOUR AUTO­
MOBILE OR BOAT with your 
State Farm Insurance agent. 
Leo Fetsch, Monday, 
422-4259.  2-2 tfc

REA PUM° CO. Sales & 
Repairs, South Hwy. 277, 
Monday, Tpxas. Phone 422- 
4402 Monday, 24 hours 864- 
3372 Haskell ■ 7-14 tfc

DANNY WALLER WELDING
and Millwright Service—Fast, 
efficient, 24-hour service. 
Phone (817) 422-4054, Route 
1, Monday, Texas. 2-9 4tp

New Truck Needed 
By Fire Department

The News office was noti­
fied Tuesday of this week that 
a fire protection project is 
being considered by the Knox 
City Fire Department, the 
City of Knox City, as well as 
residents of the town.

The City Council was ap­
proached Monday night of 
thjs week by local fireman 
Randy Coale with the idea of 
purchasing a new fire truck 
for the city to replace the 1952 
Chevrolet which, according to 
Coale, is no longer depend­
able. ^

Discussion resulted in the 
idea of raising the minimum 
water bill $1.00 per month. 
After a period of ten years, 
the truck would be paid for 
(With enough to make a down 
payment on another model or 
use the monies for mainten­
ance of other vehicles as well 
as building a new fire hall. All 
comments concerning the 
matter should bej-dKected to 
the City Hall, Coale said.

Coale commented, about 
the volunteer vyork the fire­
men do as well as their other 
jobs around town. He further 
stated that some of the mem­
bers had been with the de­
partment for 25 years and 
younger volunteers are need­
ed.

REAL ESTATE

BAYLOR MILLING CO.
Throckmorton Highway, Sey­
mour. Custom Mixing - Pel- 
letting — Your grain or ours. 
Range Cubes, creep feeds, 
hog feeds, start to finish. 
888-3921 10-10 tfc

HAY FOR SALE-Good
bright hay. M.H. Mansfield, 
658-3200.____________ 2-9 2tp

FOR SALE-Firewood, $35.00 
cord at farm. Lloyd Waldrip, 
658-3137.  ^ 3  tfc

FOR SALE” Two plus acres 
with metal building. Call 
658-3131. 2-9 2tc

ALFALFA
$2.50 a

HAY for sale, 
bale. 658-3440.

1-12 tfc

FOR SALE—Nice stock dog. 
Border Collie, pretty well- 
trained after .stock. Montgo­
mery, 658-3369. 2-9 Itp

NOTICE—Dishes brought to 
the Tankersley home may be 
picked up at the kitchen of the 
First Baptist Church, 2-9 Itc

FOR SALE - Knox City 
School Store. Walter Rauch, 
658-3440. 1-12 tfc

=><=

: Streams In
Desert Places

By Ozelle Stephens

“ Friendship with God is 
reserved for those who rever­
ence him, with them he 
shares the secrets of his 
promises.”  (Ps. 25:14).

When you are over­
whelmed in deep distress, 
sorrow and unbearable trou­
bles; all you have to do is to 
renew your friendship with 
God. His Word invites,you to 
come to Him, to love and 
reverence him and He will lift 
you out of all your troubles. 
He is the best friend you can 
ever have. No one else can do 
as much for you.

Don’t keep ignoring him 
and turning away from him 
until you are destroyed or 
trapped in great troubles. His 
Word says, “ I am the Lord 
your God, and there is noth­
ing too hard for me.”

Don’t wait too long, turn 
your heart to God, call upon 
Him, for he loves you and will 
rescue you from all your 
troubles. Remember He is 
your friend and will share his 
secret promises with you 
daily; also his wisdon. He will 
fill your troubled soul with 
peace and joy because he 
loves you.

Ô’Brien, Benjamin 
|Win Tournament
\ The O’Brien sixth grade 
l^oys took top honors in the 
b ’Brien fifth and sixth grade 
tournament held last week, 
thirst place winners in the 
g ir ls ’ division went ot Ben­
jamin.
• Second place trophies were 
-^iwarded to the Rule boys 
•with the O’Brien #1 girls’ 
jleam winning its division.
C Consolation honors went tor
•Ihe O’Brien fifth grade team 
*^ith  Goree’s lasses winning 
;4heir final contest.
> Jim Dillon, sponsor of the 
J^senior class which sponsored 
Mhe event, again thanked the 
i p ’Brien Co-Op Gin, Tri-State 
Chemicals, O’Brien Food 
lllStore, and Penman Butane 
s>/ho contributed money for 
J^he trophies and also to Steve 
i^Mcllhaney and Charles Reed 
^ o r  their assistance during the 
^tournament.

S APPLICATIONS
;5 being taken for ♦

jf

n-
CONTACT

Bassmasters To 
Elect Officers Mon.

ivlembers of the Bassmas­
ters organization will meet 
Monday night, February 13, 
at 7;30 p.m. in the Kennel.

According to Marvin Jones, 
club president, purpose of the 
meeting is to elect officers for 
the coming year.

CALL IN YOUR NEWS 
658-3142

RESIDENTIAL
FOR SALE - Three bedroom, one and three-fourth bath, 
large kitchen, living room, carport with storage room. 1105 
South Fifth.
FOR SALE - Three bedroom, one bath, large living room, 
kitchen, corner lots, new carpet. Garage and storage room. 
FOR SALE - Two bedroom, living room, kitchen, utility 
room, garage. Large corner lot, needs work. Priced to allow 
for work.
FOR SALE - Older house with good lot.
FOR SALE - Two bedroom, living room, one batn, kitchen, 
corner lot, workshop with carport. Priced to sell.
FOR SALE - Country home. One mile north of Monday on 
Rhineland Highway. Two bedroom, frame in good 
condition. No city or water authority tax.
FOR SALE - Two bedroom living room, kitchen, one bath, 
new siding. Large lot, ready for immediate occupancy. 
North Second Street. 1-26 tfc

'A ' FOR SALE IN O’BRIEN - Completely remodeled and 
ready for immediate occupancy. Three bedroom, two 
bath, large living room beautiful corner lot. Five mature 
pecan trees, workshc^n Great buy. 1-19 tfc

. COMMERCIAL
FOR SALE - Feed store with office and large warehouse.
Good business.
FOR SALE - Texaco Service Station with an operator. 
Excellent location.
FOR SALE - iron clad building on west main.
FOR SALE - Going department store in Knox City. 
Excellent opportunity. Owner retiring.

_ _  DAVID COU NTS
I I J Insurance and Real Estate 
I  102 N. Ave. A

[817] 658-3211

FOR SALE - Four bedroom, 
two bath home. Good location, 
remodeled 1976. Beautiful 
new ktichen, large den, fen­
ced yard on corner lot. Also 
has a one bedroom rent house 
on back of lot. 12-29 tfc
FOR SALE - Two older homes 
which need some repairs but 
have good prices and good 
financing. 12-29 tfc
FOR SALE - Three bedroom, 
one bath. Remodeled three 
years ago, good location, 
corner lot. A good price with 
good financing. 12-29tfc 

arnold insurance 
and

real estate

WANTED - Good used furni­
ture and appliances. We buy 
and sell. Lee Used Furniture, 
120 N. Swenson (one Block 
north of red light on Highway 
277), Stamford, Texas, phone 
915 773-5608________2-10 tfc

WANT TO BUY-Desk, call 
Glenna Benson, 658-3326 af­
ter 5:00 p.m. 2-9 2tp

THAT IN ACCORDANCF 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE OF 
TEXAS CRIMINAL TRES­
PASS (SENATE BILL 111 
PASSED BY THE 62nd LE­
GISLATURE), NOTICE IS 
HEREBY GIVEN THAT ALL 
LANDS OF W.T. WAG­
GONER ESTATE ARE POS­
TED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

KILLEN M. MOORE 
3-11 tfc_________ TRUSTFF

NO DUMPING ON OR NEAR 
A PUBLIC HIGHWAY OR 
COUNTY, IN OR NEAR 
WATERS IN STATE OF 
TEXAS

In Accordance with Article 
4477-9 and paragraph H.1.3. 
Article 6674V-2, Veroon’s Ci­
vil Statutes: Any PERSON, 
Municipal or Private Corpor­
ation or Firm who dumps or 
disposes of trash, junk, gar­
bage, refuse, unsightly mat­
ter, rubbish, dead animals or 
other solid waste on or near 
(within 300 yards) a Public 
Highway or County rights-of- 
way, on Public or Private 
Property of Texas without the 
consent of the owner, his 
agent or Public Official in 
charge shall be guilty of a 
misdemeanor and upon con­
viction shall be fined not less 
than $15.00, nor more than 
$ 200.00 .

Every Law Enforcement 
Officer of this State and its 
sub-division shall have the 
authority to enforce the pro­
visions of this statute.

Knox County 
Commissioners Court 

1-26 3tc

We would 'ke to express 
our sincere thankr to our 
friends and relatives for the 
cards. flowe''s, food and other 
expressions of sympathy dur­
ing the recent loss of my 
husband, Joe Rojas.

May God bless each of you.
. The Family of 

2-9 Itp  Maria Rojas

FOR SALE-401 acre Knox 
County rahch' i^5  acres cul­
tivation. 2 water wells, 2 
large tanks, 2 small tanks.

12-8 tfc
LISTINGS NEEDED for ah
Homes and Farms. We have 
the buyers. 10-20 tfc

Alton Hester 
Home Phone 

[806] 745-4216 
Hewitt & Hewitt Realtors 

[806] 793-0604 
Lubbo»*k, Teya.«5

PLOW DISCS - Chisel 
Sweeps and Spikes, Krause 
Plow Parts, Rolling Cultiva­
tor Bearings and Bearings for 
all types o f . Plows, Fram 
Filters, Fuel Lub and air for 
John Deere, Case and IHC 
Tractors, Irrigation Tubes 
and Socks. EGENBACHER 
IMPLEMENT Phone 817 658- 
3242. 4-21 tfc

HESSTON STAKHAND 10
System. Builds stacks of hay 
or stover to one and one- 
fourth tons. Also. Hesston 
Model 5400 Round Bale Sys­
tem. Woodard Farm Sales, 
Haskell. 12-22 tfc

FOR SALE - 1975 Dodge 
Cornet Brougham, extra 
clean. Chad Wilson, 658-3563.

1-12 tfc
1972 CHEVROLET Pickup for 
sale. Also round bale feeders 
for big round bales. Call 
454-3231 or see Buddy Tolson, 
Benjamin. 2-9 2tc

FOR SALE - 1974 Grandville 
Pontiac, low mileage. Call 
658-3262. 1-12tfc

USE THE CLASSIFIEDS

All Types 
Welding
Specializing in 
Oil Field Work
24-HR. SERVICE

CALL

Shelton Boyd 
[817] 658-3639

One Acre
Country Homesites 

On Munday Highway
For Information, Contact

C.G. Clarke
658-3845 501 Main

Church School 
Morning Worship 
Evening Worship

10:00
11:00
6:00

James P. Patterson, Pastor

First United Methodist Church
406 S. Second Knox City, Texas

Friday Night Fish Supper
ALL YOU CAN EAT

Cole Slaw, French Fries 
Hush Puppies

$2.50
5:00 till -

DAIRY MART
Mr. & Mrs. Wayne Callaway 

658-8969

5  L.V.N. Position
•y
y

Director of Nurses J 
§  KNOX COUNTY *  
^  HOSPITAL t

^  X-

Plumbing Heating 
Air-Conditioning 

JER R Y'S  PLUMBING
658-3322 207 N. Central Knox City

AUTO P A IN TIN G
AMO B O D Y  W o r k

Painting - Repairing - Rebuilding 
Windshields - Seat Covers - Door Glass

FRAME STRAIGHTENING WHEEL ALIGNING
24-Hour Wrecker Service

Lewis Paint & Body Shop
Sterling Lewis, Owner 
Ciiox City, Texas

Telephone 6S8-3342 
Nights Dial 658-3330

The Knox County News is 
authorized to make the fol­
lowing political announce­
ments, subject ot the action of 
the Democratic Primary in 
May. All political advertising 
must be paid in advance.

For U.S. Congressman,
17th District

A.L. [DUSTY] RHODES 
CHARLES W. STENHOLM 

FIKE GODFREY 
JIM SNOWDEN

For State Senator,
30th District

RAY FARABEE
(re-election)

For State Representative, 
101st Legislative District 

W.S. [BILL] HEATLY 
(Re-Election)

For County Judge,
Knox County

HOMER T. MELTON

For County Treasurer 
Knox County

J.T. CYPERT 
(Re-Election)

For County-District Clerk 
Knox County

GLORIA WEST

For County Commissioner 
Precinct 2, Knox County 

BOBBY ROBERSON 
(Re-Election)

For Justice of the Peace 
Precinct 1, Knox County 

GUY BRADLEY 
(Re-Election)

It Pays To 
Advertise

The Knox 
County News

P. O. Box 7
Knox City, Texas 79529 
T elephone 817 658-3142

Piilye B. Angle P u b lish e r/ Editor 
Stacy Angle A.ssistant Editor
i
Published at Knox City, Texas 
79529, every T hursday. Second 
Class Postage Paid at Knox City, 
Texas 79529.

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
One Y ear Subscrip tion  w ithin 

50 m iles of Knox Citv (iii-
..............................................................  $ 6 .

One Y ear E tse.vhere in Texas
1 ____  $7.

One Y ear Out of S tate  (no 
....................................,  ..............$8.

NOTICE—Any erro n eo u s re flec ­
tion  upon the  ch a rac te r , stan d ­
ing, o r repu ta tion  of any person, 
firm , o r co rpo ra tion , which may 
appear in th e  colum ns of th is 
pap er will gladly be corrected  
upon notice of sam e tie.;..^, 
b rough t to  the a tten tion  of the 
pwhilsher.

O. H. BartUy 
R « g is f « r « d  

Public Surveyor
Phone 888-2454 
Sevmour. Texas

T ? W £ R  D R I V E  I N
RULE, TEXAS -

Show Starts at 6:45

TilUll. rbb. 9 
?3 QO CARLOAD'

■‘EL
LATIGO” 

All Spanish

t KiDAV AND SATURDAY 
FEBRUARY 10-11 

W»->.
PiCROMiSEfi

B IBI  A N D E R S - I O N ,  K A T H L E E N  Q U I N L A f  
S Y L V I A  S I D N E Y  M A R T I N I  B A R T L E T T  
L O R R A I N E  G A R Y  S I G N E  H A S S O

SUNDAY, Fc-BRUARY 12

their Virgin Skin Violated

.COLOR

CUSTOM HOMES
By

D A V E  O X F O R D

WILL CUSTOM-BUILD TO 
SUIT YOUR REQUIREMENTS

FREE ESTIMATES

[817] 454-3641 Benjamin, Texas

STOP Expensive Painting

United States Steel Siding
UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING  

ALUM INUM  REPLACEMENT WINDOWS
-100% FINANCING AVAILABLE-

C.W . ‘Dutch’ Benson Construction
Benjamin, Texais -Authorized Dealer- Phone 817 454-2281

V

so DO WE . . . OUR 
FINE CUSTOMERS!
You can be sure it's true when we say we love all our 

wonderful customers — and this Valentine's Day greet­

ing is just our way of saying "Thanks" for your patron­

age. We hope we can continue to give you the out­

standing banking service you deserve.

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK

MEMBER F .D .I.C .-IN S U R E D T O $40,000 
Knox City, Texas



O ’Brien Happenings
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By CHARLENE BROTHERS
<>f--------- u  i>»-

Producers Say Farm 
Legislation Inadequate

February 9, 1978 The Knox County Newa PAGE THREE

District To Sponsor Essay Contest

You might call this a be­
lieve it or not column or you 
will probably call It some­
thing else. Anyway, do you 
know where the coldest place 
in Texas was Saturday? It was 
the Dallas-Fort Worth area, 
and I; was there with only a 
lightweight coat and not the 
warmest clothes you can find. 
Never again will I believe the 
weather report from the 
WBAP Radio station. They 
were telling all day Friday 
that the temperature would 
be in the 50’s by Saturday 
afternoon with the sun shin­
ing. Well, as you know it was 
not. They said it got up to 41 
degrees, but I ’m^ not so sure 
I believe them. I nearly froze 
to death, it seemed like. We 
went to the Stock Show that 
afternoon and going in and 
out the the buildings, hitting 
the wind was really cold.Most 
of the animals were already 
gone, so it was kinda dreary. 
If I ever go back I’m taking 
the warmest clothes I have 
plus my boots. (How I found 
out where the coldest place 
was, when we heard the news 
Saturday night on the TV, 
they said that that area had 
the lowest temperature in 
Texas.) I believe that!
HERE AND THERE

There were several people 
attending the Stock Show in 
Fort Worth during the week 
including Mr. and Mrs. F.D. 
Emerson, Mike Oliver and 
Daniel Godsey; Keith Rowan 
and Craig Brothers, and Mr. 
and Mrs. J.M. Emerson, J. 
and Justin. If there were 
others I did not find out about 
them. I understand that the 
Knox City-O’Brien students 
carried away several of the 
top honors.

Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Rowan 
were in Lubbock last week 
helping their daughter, Gail, 
move into a new place.

Visiting in the home of 
Bernice Rowan during the 
weekend were Mr. and Mrs. 
Lowell Rowan, Paul and Da­
vid of Denton, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Rowan and baby

daughter of Henrietta and 
Mr. and Mrs. Trey Burson 
and Traci of Haskell. They all 
attended the funeral services 
for Bobby Tankersley.

Mrs. Patsy Covey and 
daughters of Snyder visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. Coy 
Hewitt and Toni and Mr. and 
Mrs. C.W. Covey during the 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. James Man­
ning, Cody and Christie and 
Marvin Manning are visiting 
a few days in Silsbee and 
aroung the Houston area.

Mr. and Mrs. J.O. Bro­
thers visited during the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Brothers, Jeremy and 
Tommy in Azie. They also 
visited in Springtown with the 
Derwin Lancaster family and 
the Larry Gibson family.

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy John­

ston, Wendy and Jamie of 
Lubbock visited with his pa­
rents, Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Johnston during the week­
end.

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Duncan 
of Wichita Falls visited with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clifton Duncan, during the 
weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. R.M. John­
ston visited in Lubbock dur­
ing the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Alton Hester Sr.

Mr. arid Mrs. Sam John­
ston visited in Burkburnett 
with Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Johnston monday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Orval Man­
ning visited in Lorenzo seve­
ral days last week with C.L. 
Pharr.

On Monday, they visited in 
Abilene with Mr. and Mrs. 
Royce Manning and Brad and 
Mr. and Mrs. Cash Powers.

WASHiNGTON, D.C.-Re- 
presentatives of the national 
Grain Sorghum Producers 
Association told the House 
Committee on Agriculture to­
day that the new farm legis­
lation is not adequate, espe­
cially in the way it is being 
administered. The organiza­
tion, which represents the 
nation’s thousands of grain 
sorghum farmers, stated that 
Congress enforce a program 
which will control production, 
create demand and allow 
prices to rise.

Abeldt outlined three 
points which would accomp­
lish the stated goals: (1) raise 
government support levels— 
keeping in mind that parity is 
a reasonable price for farmers 
to seek and expect; (2) re­
quire each producer in the 
U.S. to restrict his plantings 
proportionately so that the 
total U.S. production will not 
exceed the amount that the

Planned Conservation Completed
Several Knox County 

farmers have completed their 
planned conservation work 
under the Great Plains Con­
servation Program. Arche 
Lieb of the U.S. Soil Conser­
vation Service reports that 
James Reid and P.F. Homer 
of Monday and Tommy 
Richardson of Knox City 
completed thier GP contracts 
in 1977.

Cost share assistance 
through the GPCP covers all 
phases of conservation work

on the farm or ranch. Cost 
sharing ranges from 50 % to 
80% depending on the type of 
practices needed. Lieb said a 
contract can be prepared to 
complete the needed conser­
vation work in from three to 
ten years depending on the 
type of operation and the 
desires of the producer.

Some of the contracts com­
pleted in 1977 took as long as 
six years to complete, Lieb 
continued. These completed 
contracts make a total of 159

Students Preparing 
Conservation Posters

Students in the Wichita- 
Brazos Soil and Water con­
servation District are prepar­
ing conservation posters as a 
part of their instructional 
program.

Grades one through eight 
in Benjamin, Goree, Munday 
and Knox City-O’Brien will 
compete for awards.

McKinney Rites Held
Funeral services for Mrs. 

Myrtle A. McKinney were 
held Tuesday afternoon at 
three o’clock in the Church of 
Christ with Travis Boyd, 
minister, officiating. Burial 
followed in the Knox City 
Cemetery with Smith Funeral 
Home in charge of arrange­
ments.

Mrs. McKinney, 86, died 
lyionday, February 6, at 7:20

Locals’ Kin 
Buried Wed.

Funeral services tor Mrs. 
Sam Joe Fought of Haskell, 
daughter of Elzie Marion of 
Knox City, were held Wed­
nesday afternoon at 2:30 
o’clock in the East Side 
Baptist Church with the Rev. 
Jim Griffith, pastor, officiat­
ing. Burial followed at the 
Willow Cemetery.

Mrs. Fought, 56, died at 
1:55 p.m. Monday, February 
6, in the Haskell Memorial 
Hospital following a long 
illness.

Born September 4, 1921, in 
Sanger, she married Sam Joe 
Fought on August 28, 1940, 
in Weinert. She had come to 
Weinert as a child with her 
parents and had lived in 
Haskell County since that 
time. Mrs. Fought was a 
member of the East Side 
Baptist Church.

Survivors include her hus­
band; a daughter, Mrs. Gary 
Davis of Stamford; her father, 
Mr. Marion of Knox City; two 
brothers, Dickie Marion and 
Joe Marion, both of Knox 
City; three sisters, Martha 
Faye Booe of Munday, M il­
dred Japes of Knox City, and 
Mrs. Marvin Stiewert of Has­
kell.

a.m. in the Brazos Valley 
Care Home after an extended 
illness.

Born September 23, 1891, 
in Fort Townsend, Oklahoma, 
her first husband, Laffette 
Clark died in 1916. Jessie F. 
McKinney, her second hus­
band, preceded her in death 
on March, 10, 1938. Mrs. 
McKinney was a seamstress 
and a member of the Church 
of Christ. She moved to Knox 
City from Midland in 1967.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Lucille Fereen of 
Stephenville and Mrs. Ray­
mond Bales of Knox City; a 
son, L.L. Clark of Las Crucec, 
New Mexico; 12 grandchild­
ren; 10 great-grandchildren; 
and one great-great-grand- 
child.

Pallbearers included Ben 
Bingham, Joe Fletcher, Bud 
Thompson, and Leroy Davis.

Awards will be given ror 
winners in each of the grades 
in each school with winners 
from each school competing 
for awards on the district 
level. Posters are being pre­
pared under the supervision 
of the classroom teachers.

The Board of Directors of 
the conservation district is 
sponsoring the contest and 
providing awards.

Current members of the 
board are L.D. Offutt, Mun­
day; Charles Griffith, Benja­
min; Emil Naveratil, Gilliland; 
Billy Kinnibrough, Vera; and 
Clifford Cornett, Knox City.

ATTEND STOCK SHOW

Mr. and Mrs. Max Bradley, 
David and Dusty attended the 
Fort Worth Fat Stock Show 
Saturday afternoon.

Other members of Sandy’s 
family attending with them 
were her brother and his 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Kennith 
Stubblefield and boys of 
Hurst; her sister-in-law and 
family, Mrs. Jacque Stubble­
field and girls of Denton; and 
her aunt, Willie Stubblefield 
of Dallas.

FROM WASHINGTON
Sgt. and Mrs. Jay Eaton, 

Jay Bob and Jessica, of Lacey 
Washington, are visiting in 
Knox City with family and 
friends.

Jay is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J.C. Eaton and his wife, 
Elaine, is the daughter of 
former Knox City residents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Alton Hester of 
Lubbock.

IN ABILENE
Mrs. Jessie Teague spent 

Friday night in Abilene with 
her daughter and her family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Luke Pointer, 
Denise and Mark.

Mrs. Teague was there to 
attend a bridal shower in 
honor of her granddaughter 
Denise, who is to be married 
February 25.

She also attenoeo a Satur­
day luncheon in the bride- 
elect’s honor in the home of 
Mrs. Lee Roy Baker and 
Margaret Lee.

Greer Rites 
Held Feb. 2

Funeral services for former 
Rochester resident, Mrs. 
W illie Rose Greer of Arling­
ton, were held Thursday af­
ternoon, February 2, at two 
o’clock in , the First United 
Methodist Church in Roches­
ter with the Rev. Aubrey 
Headstream, church pastor, 
officiating. Burial was in the 
Rochester Cemetery under 
the direction of Smith Funeral 
Home.

Mrs. Greer, 89, died Tues- 
say, January 31, at Commun­
ity Hospital in Grand Prairie 
following a lengthy illness.

Born February 15, 1888, in 
Patrick, Texas, she married 
James A. Greer on Septem­
ber 8, 1909, in Stamford. 
They moved to Rochester in 
1927 and owned and operated 
the Rochester Reporter until 
1953. Her husband preceded 
her in death on May 26, 1961, 
in Irving. She was a member 
of the United Methodist 
Church.

Survivors include three 
sons, Luther of Irving, Frank 
of Garland, and Thomas of 
Edinburg; two daughters, 
Mrs. Ina Ruth Wolcott of Fort 
Worth and Mrs. Sarah 
Knouse of Irving; a brother. 
Jack Shaw of Terrell- two 
sisters, Mrs. Jessie Ellis and 
Mrs. Hillard Macy, both of 
Fort Worth; seven grand­
children and five great­
grandchildren.

The Land Bank 
...money to keep 

the farm 
in the family

One of agriculture’s toughest challenges 
is keeping the farm in the family. It 
takes long-term planning and, often, 
long-term credit. For more than three 
generations, the Land Bank has helped 
farm families pass along what they have 
worked so hard to build. We may be 
able to help you, too.

FEDERAL LAND BANK 
ASSOCIATION OF HASKELL

JOE HARPER, Manager

Offices at Haskell, Anson, and Seymour 
Haskell (817)864-2062 
Anson (915)823-1142 

Long-time Loans on Farms and Rapches 
In Haskell, Jones, Baylor, and Knox Counties

market will readily consume; 
and (3) expand, foreign sales 
of U.S. agricultural products 
through trade negotiations, 
expanded market develop­
ment programs, and liberal­
ized credit programs to po­
tential customers.

Abeldt emphasized that 
only a nationwide cutback in 
plantings will be effective in 
reducing stocks and sur­
pluses thereby allowing 
prices to naturally increase. 
He countered the argument 
that if farm prices reach 
parity levels that “ we will 
price ourselves out of the 
market’ ’ by saying “ if we do 
not receive profitable prices, 
we farmers will be priced 
right out of business.’ ’

The House hearings are 
being held at the request of 
farm state congressmen who 
want to get the views of all 
interested parties as to what 
action might be taken to help 
the financially distresed 
American farmer.

The Board of Directors of 
the Wichita-Brazos Soil and 
Water Conservation District 
is sponsoring a Conservation 
Essay contest for all students 
in grades nine through twelve 
in the Soil Conservation Dis­
trict.

Schools eligible to partici­
pate are Goree, Benjamin, 
Munday, and Knox City- 
O’Brien. The directors’ soon-

soTh'; of this acitvity is 
hoped to stimulate a greater 
interest and appreciation in 
the conservation of our na­
tural resources.

Directors have arranged to 
give some appropriate 
awards to the winners of the 
first three places in each 
school and the overall winner 
in the district.

drive
M e r id b r

The title of the essay this 
year will be “ Conservation 
Today For The Future Of 
Tomorrow”  and may contain 
p to 300 words.

Tho winning essay frorp. 
each school should be turnetj 
in to the Soil Conservation 
Service Office in Knox City by 
February 17. y

Rules pertaining to the 
contest have been distr'huted 
to the schools in the district 
and the district directors wish 
to encourage each school to 
participate.

Members of the Board of 
Directors of the conservation 
district are L.D. Offutt, Mun; 
day; Emil Naveratil, Gilliland; 
Charles Griffith, Benjamin; 
Billy Kinr'brugh, Vera; and 
Clifford Cornett, Knox City.

NO TIC
on over 120,000 acres to be 
completed in Knox County 
since the program started in 
the 1950’s. These completed 
GPCP contracts represent 
many acres of grassed water­
ways, farm ponds, miles of 
parallel terraces, diversion 
terraces, brush management, 
grass plantings and conser­
vation cropping systems. The 
completed conservation work 
is having a great impact on 
pollution abatement by con­
trolling wind and water ero­
sion.

Applications for cost shar­
ing under the GPCP can be 
made at the SCS office in 
Knox City, According to Lieb. 
Producers recently applying 
for assistance under the pro­
gram are White Hudson and 
W.E. Barnes of Knox City 
and Ralph Caram and John 
Kinnibrugh of Gilliland.

All programs and services 
of the U.S. Department of 
Agriculture are available to 
everyone without regard to 
race, creed, color, sex, or 
national origin.

Randy Pack Enters 
School Of Pharmacy

Randy Pack has enrolled 
for the spring semester at the 
Southwestern State Univer­
sity School of Pharmacy in 
Weatherford, Oklahoma.

A 1974 honor graduate of 
Knox City High School, 
Randy has attended Texas 
Tech University in Lubbock, 
the University of Texas at 
Austin, and Southwest 
Texas State University in San 
Marcos.

Randy is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. W.E. Pack of Knox City.

For those of you who asked for eight- 
track tapes of our new album, “ A Little 
Bit Country...” , they are now available 
at The Knox County News office. Also 
available at the News office as well as at 
Bob’s Super Save and The Art Stall in the 
Mini Mall are albums of the latest 
release. The two previous albums along 
with tapes are also still on sale and all 
albums as well as the tapes are $5.00, 
plus .25 tax.

The Angle Sisters

HERE FOR FUNERAL
Mrs. Phyllis Nixon and 

Jodie of Andrews and Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy Hollis, Rob­
bie and Holly of Richardson 
were here over the weekend 
to attend the funeral services 
of their cousin, Bobby Tan­
kersley.

While here, they visited in 
the home of their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Tanker­
sley and Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Hollis.

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND 
LOAN A^SOCUTION 

OF STAMFORD
The Fastest Growing In The Big Country

Where Your Savings Interest is CompoundeJ Oaily — Paid Quarterly

Are You Interested In The Future... 
DOUBLE

YOUR MONEY IN
JUST 9 YEARS!

7 . 7 5 %  In te re st-C o m p o un d e d  D o ily -Fo r 9 Y e a rs

TODAY $1,000.00 9 Years $2,008.57
TODAY $5,000.00 9 Years $10,042.87
TODAY $10,000.00 9 Years $20,085.74

HERfTSBOW YOin MONEY CAN C»OW WITH
T *rm • • f in n in g  i« lo n 6 * A n n u a l Y i« ld •a lo n e *  o t M a tw rify

7.75% , 6-Year 
Caftifkatc, 
LOOO.OO Minimum

nooo.oo
5,000.00

10 ,000.00

•A 6%
$.06%
8.06%

1,591.93
7,959.67

15,919.35

7.50% , 4-Yuor 
Curtifkatu, 
1,000.00 Minimum

1 .000. 00
5 .000. 00

10,090.00

7.79%
7.79%
7.79%

1,349.82
6,749.08

13,498.17
----- ----------------------------------------- 1

6.75% , 2V^-Y*ar 
Cuftificatu,
1,000.00 Minimum

1,000.00
5,000.00

10,000.00

6.98%
6.98%
6.98%

1
1,183.81
5,919.0$

11,838.05

6.50% , I-Ym t  
Curtificotu, 
1,000.00 MininHMn

1,000.00
5,000.00

10,000.00

6.72%
6.72%
6.72%

1,067.15
5,335.76

10,671.53

5.75% , 90 Day Nutim 
Cartificatu,
560.00 Minimum

1,000.00
5,000.00

10,000.00

S.92%
5.92%
5.92%

1,053.90
5,269.49

10,538.99

5.25%  ftwbeofc 
Account.** 
$5.00 Minimum

1,000.00
5,000.00

10.000.00

5.39%
5.39%
5.39%

1,014.48!
5,072.39

10,144.71

**Eartiings on Passbuuk Account ate B «ed on I -Yett.

Annual Yield is Bated on Compounding 
Imereti Earningt From Daie of Deposit co the 
Maturity Date
Imereti on Cenificaie Accoumi Paid From 
Date of Deposit to Date of Maturity. In By the 
lOlh., Earn from the IM.
Interest on Patsbook Accounts Paid From Date 
of Deposit to Date of Withdrawal.
A Substantial Interest Penalty is Requiretl for Early 
Withdrawal, on Certirnate Accounts.

Why Not Put Your Money to Work for You 
With First Federal Savings and. Loan Associa­
tion of Stamford and Watch it Grow!

You Will Receive Security and Reliability in 
Your Savings Plan. And, All Accounts are 
Insured up to $40,000 by the FSLIC.

To Open a Savings Account, Visit Any of Our 3 
Conveniently Located Offices or Call Us.

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND 
LOAN ASSOCIATION

DM sian O f f ic ;
O uaiK ih F « la ra l Swtings and  lo a n  

313 South M otn Sf. 
Q uanah. Taxas 79333 

817.A «3-S 3n

■ranch OHicof 
# 3  Aranu. 0  
9. O. ■ «  444 

Hash.ll, T.aas 79331 
•  I7.a64.3l79

Hw m  Offtcoi 
133 W. McHotp 
9. O. •e a S n  

Stondwd, T.a.s 79333 
915-773.3714

Ahilwa. 
CUSTOMtS 
Toll Fra. Coll 

Dial -O- Aak For 
tNTH9MSC •4013
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Kennel
SENIOR CLASS NEWS
by Peggy Gutierrez 

Last Monday, Tuesday, 
and Wednesday the whole 
high school had to write in 
300 words or less a soil 
conservation essay.

Also last Monday, Thurs­
day, and Saturday the Senior 
Class sponsored the Fifth and 
Sixth grade tournament. We 
would like to thank our pa­
rents, Mr. Dillon, Coach 
Reed and eisp everyone for 
helping out the Seniors by 
coming to tfw tournament.

Thursday, we had an in­
structor from Vernon Junior 
College to talk to us about the 
campus and he also answered 
several ques;|ions asked.

We also had to write our 
autobiographies for Seniors 
of the Week for the newspa­
per.

SOPHOMORE CLASS NEWS
by Gerri Watson 

The Sophomore Class boys 
and girls did very well at the 
livestock show last week in

BREAKFAST MENUS: 
Fvebruary 13-17, 1978 
lOlonday: Orange Wedges, 
dinnamon Toast, M ilk 
liuesday: Orange Juice, Sau­
sage, Buttered Toast and 
Jjelly, Milk
\yednesday: Grape Juice,
Sjcrambled Egg's, Buttered 
TJoast and Jelly, M ilk 
Thursday: Orange Juice, Hot 
Biscuits, Butter and Syrup, 
Klilk
F̂ riday: Applesauce, Dough- 
r|uts, M ilk

LUNCH MENUS:
February 13-17, 1978 
Monday: Tacos, Taco Sauce, 
Lettuce and Tomato Salad, 
Cheese, Whole Kernel Corn, 
Cinnamon Rolls, Milk 
Tuesday: Hot Dog with Chili, 
French Fries, Crisp Celery 
Sticks, Apricot Cobbler, Milk 
Wednesday: Chicken Fried 
Steak, Mashed Potatoes, 
Gravy, Seasoned Carrots, 
Honey, Hot Rolls and Butter, 
Milk
Thursday: Chicken and
Noodles, Green Beans, Let­
tuce, and Tomato Salad, 
Cranberry and Fruit Salad, 
Hot Batter Bread and Butter, 
Milk
Friday: Western Burgers,
Baked Beans, Crisp Dill 
Pickle Slices, Apple Crisp, 
Milk

Class Of 1958 
Planning Reunion

Help! Members of the 
Knox City High School gra­
duating class of 1958 are 
planning a 20th reunion 
scheduled for sometime dur­
ing 1978.

According to Glenna Voss 
Benson, members of the class 
relatives of someone in this 
group, or anyone knowing a 
class member, are asked to 
contact Mrs. Benson, Rt. 1, 
Box 14, Kncx City, Texas 
79529 as soon as possible.

• Members of the graduating 
class include Stella Acosta, 
Jerry Don Anderson, Doug 
Bradley, Joe Cash, Bobby 
Day, Jimmy Dutton, John Ed 
Culp, Tim Edwards, Jimmy 
Finley, Bill Gilpin, Glenda 
Givens, Beverly James, Jerry 
Johnston, and Shag Lewis.

Also, Jimmy Mahan, Alice 
McCarty, Jimmy McNulty, 
Richard Melvin, R.L. Moon, 
|S.E. Park, Bobby Posey, 
Patsy Robinson, Jan Stoder, 
Lynelle Tankersley, and Joey 
Watkins.

IN GRAHAM HOME
J Visiting here last week with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
L.W. Graham, was Dale Gra­
ham of Pasadena, Texas.
! Dale’s wife. Gay, came to 
Knox City by plane with 
'friends Mike Beaumont and 
•his daughter Dana after 
■school was out Friday after­
moon.
; Gay and Dale returned 
;home by carbon ,Saturday.

;a t t e n d  f u n e r a l
J Among those here Sunday 
[afternoon attend funeral 
[services for Bobby Tanker- 
[sley were fifn.-'and Mrs. Don 
[Tankersley of Lubbock, Mr. 
[and Mrs. 3am Tankersley of 
(Stamford, and Mrs. Hazel 
Eastland, also of Stamford

Fort Worth. Gaylynn Burk- 
ham won third in Spotted 
Poland China and sixth in 
Chester White. Simone Cobb 
showed in the Duroc division. 
Shelton Rhodes won third in 
Spotted Barrow, Cyle Clayton 
won eighth in Yorkshire bar- 
row, Greg Oliver won fifth, 
sixth, and eleventh in York­
shire barrow, Kyle White 
won third and fourth in 
Spotted barrow, Joseph God- 
sey won seventh in Yorkshire 
barrow, and Russel Hacker 
showed in Hampshire barrow. 
Congratulations to all! 
GREENHAND NEWS 
by Simone Cobb

Last week several of the 
Greenhands left for the Fort 
Worth Fat Stock show. They 
all did very well in showing 
their livestock.

We also are studying the 
types of cattle and the kinds 
of beef.
PASF NEWS 
by Terri Harris

Last Sunday, the PASF 
Club had their annual Mexi­
can Dinner. The dinner turn­
ed out successful. Thanks to 
everybody that came!

The next thing cornin’ up 
for PASF members is the 
convention that will be held 
March 2 and 3 in San Antonio. 
Fifteen members and the 
sponsors will be able to 
attend.

Thursday, February 9-Pic­
ture retakes
Friday, February 10-Ready 
Writing tryouts, 1:00 to 3:00 
p.m.; Basketball at Haskell, 
5:00 p.m., GBG 
Tuesday, February 14—Bas­
ketball at Rotan, BGGB, 5:00 
p.m.
Wednesday, February 15-
Noon Lions Club, Masonic 
Fellowship Hall.

Coaches 
Comments

by Jerry Lowrey
After winning their open­

ing second round game with 
Munday, Greyhounds have 
dropped three straight games, 
to Paducah 62-51, Crowell 
74-64, and Aspermont 68-56. 
In, both the Paducah and 
Crowell games, the Grey­
hounds played extremely well 
leading Paducah most of the 
game and battling the power­
ful Crowell Wildcats on al­
most even terms. After losing 
those two key games, the 
Greyhounds were mentally 
down for the Aspermont 
game and had one of our 
poorest games of the season. 
Now we are, of course, out of 
the picture as far as the 
district race is concerned but 
do have an opportunity to 
finish with our best season 
record in three years.* Cur­
rently we stand 14-9 on the 
season and winning the three 
remaining games would fi­
nish 17-9 on the season which 
would improve on our 1976-77 
record of 12-14. All three of 
these remaining games a- 
gainst Hamlin, Haskell, and 
Rotan are all on the road and 
the Greyhounds must play 
well to win any or ail of the 
games. Hamlin is currently 
tied in the second half with 
Crowell both with 4-0 records 
and the Pipers look to be
coming on strong. Haskell’s 
leading scorer who has been 
out with an injury is back now 
and this makes them much 
stronger.
KC 51, Paducah 62
Wailing, 13; Anderson, 15;
Howell, 11; Gonzales, 6; and 
Ray, 6
KC 64, Crowell 74
Mangis, 4; Walling, 22; 
Rushing, 2; Anderson, 15; 
Howell, 11; Gonzales, 8; and 
Ray, 2.
KC 56, Aspermont 68 
Walling, 10; Anderson, 15; 
Howell, 18; Gonzales, 7; Ray, 
2; and Johnson, 4.

Ag loans, services increase
A recent survey of agri­

cultural credit conditions 
in Texas shows that money 
lenders are serving more 
farmers and ranchers and 
that the average loan 
amount has increased.

Dr. Richard Trimble, 
economist in management 
for the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service who con­
ducted the survey, noted 
that one quarter of the 145 
lenders responding were 
serving more clients and 61 
percent were serving the 
same number of cus­
tomers. Sixty-nine percent 
of the lenders also indi­
cated that their average 
loan size was higher than 
1976.

“Interest rates for farm 
loans are apparently level­
ing off after four straight 
semi-annual periods of 
decline,” said the econom­
ist. Interest rates for 
feeder cattle loans are 
down from 8.26 percent to 
8.05 percent and farm and 
ranch operating loans are 
down from 8.45 percent to 
8.44 percent from last May. 
But, the rate on real estate 
loans increased from 7.87 
percent to 8 percent during 
the period.

“The majority of lenders 
surveyed also expect inter­
est rates to be higher in the 
next six months,” said 
Trimble.

Forty-four percent of the 
lenders indicated a higher 
demand for short term 
loans. More than half of the 
lenders reported a higher 
demand for operating 
loans while a third noted a 
greater demand for crop 
storage loans. On the other 
hand, the demand for the 
dairy cattle, feeder cattle 
and machinery loans was 
about the same as 1976.

“A decrease in forward 
contracts made by crop 
farmers may indicate that 
they have not been able to 
contract their crop at an 
advantageous price,” 
points out the economist. 
“Fifty-eight percent of the 
contracts were made on an 
acreage basis in contrast 
to 42 percent of the con­
tracts made on a quantity 
basis.

“Predictions among 
lenders indicate that both 
farm and ranch earnings 
will be lower through 1978. 
Fifty-eight percent of the 
lenders expect farm earrl- 
ings to be lower during the

next year than in the past 
six months. Ranch earn­
ings are expected to be the 
same or lower, according 
to three-quarters of the 
lenders surveyed. But all 
agreed that spending by 
both farmers and ranchers 
for operating inputs will go 
up during 1978,” added 
Trimble.

More farm loans are 
being refinanced by 43 per­
cent of the lenders, and 52 
percent indicated that they 
expect the demand for re­
financing farm loans to be 
greater in the next six 
months. The majority of 
lenders indicated that the 
demand for refinancing 
ranch loans was about the 
same as the previous year, 
and they expect this 
demand to remain stable 
over the next six months.

Although only 20 percent 
of the money lenders have 
used the Small Business 
Administration Agricul­
tural Loan Program, 33 
percent indicated they 
would be using this guaran­
tee program in the future.

Of the banks responding 
to the credit survey, 65 per­
cent indicated they were 
pursuing new farm and 
ranch loans. A small per­
centage indicated they are 
presently reducing the 
number of loans due to fund 
shortages.

“Reasons for lenders not 
serving loans included lack 
of equity, inadequate cash 
flow for debt service, and 
high risks of certain enter­
prises,” noted Trimble. 
“Lenders also stressed the 
need for good farm 
records, with 62 percent 
now receiving projected 
cash flow statements or 
operating budgets from 
their borrowers.” ,

GRAIN DUST—

Grain dust explosions 
can be prevented by reduc­
ing or controlling the dust 
and by eliminating sources 
of ignition points out a 
safety engineer with the 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service.

Also, explosion venting 
can release explosive pres­
sure, and there are devices 
that can detect an explo­
sion in its beginning stage 
and suppress or extin­
guished it.

FOR THE 
OFFICE

LIST FINDER
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ADMISSIONS '
Knox City: W.E. Clonts,
Gregory Rocha, John Pyles, 
Pearl Eaton, Nettie Wilcox, 
Rhonda Redwine, James
Dabney, T.P. Robinson, Ida 
King, Cecilia Rocha 
Munday: Ida Voss, Jessie 
Roberts, J.C. Elliott, Jane 
Almanrode
Benjamin: Julia Trepanier, 
Wally McNitt, Lee Snailum, 
W.E. Ryder
Rochester: Jessie Collier,
Ollie Yarbrough, James
Crane
Truscott: Mae Welch 
Commanche: Jessie Carmack 

DISMISSALS
Knox City: Odis Brown, Ara­
bella Rogers, Joe Rojas (de­
ceased), Myrtle McKinney, 
Clayton Wren, Elzie Marion, 
Eula Booe, W illie Partridge, 
Murriel Bishop, Herschel 
Tankersley
Munday: Freida Brown 
Heather LeAnn, Mary John­
son, Vera Carver, Terry 
Clendennen, Aubrey Roden 
Rochester: Kathryn Adkins, 
W.T. Adkins
Goree: Maribelle Harlan, 
Raymond Shelton 
Graham: Rhonda Eaton & 
Jeremy Craig 
Truscott: Willie Owens 
De Leon: Mabel Singleton 
Dallas: Ruth Clark

Results Of Recent 
Basketball Games

The Knox C ity-0’6rien 
girls’ basketball varsity team 
was defeated by Crowell by 
40-22 on January 31 but 
showed their strength Feb­
ruary 3 by defeating Asper­
mont 47-38.

In the KC-Crowell game 
Skiles hit the basket for 16 
points. Ware had 4 to her 
credit and Watson trailed 
with 2 points. In the game 
between KC and Aspermont 
Ware was high scorer with 30 
points, Skiles had 13 points

LOOK
WHO’S
H E R K l

drive

Texas Off ice or Traffic Safety

Mr. and Mrs. David 
Woodall of Henrietta are the 
proud parents of a baby boy 
born Sunday, February 5, at 
4:21 p.m. in Clay County 
Memorial Hospital in Hen­
rietta.

The young lad has been 
named Paul Alan and weigh­
ed ten pounds and five 
ounces. He measured 21 and 
one-half inches in length.

Maternal grandmother is 
Mrs. Ada Moorman of A l­
bany, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Woodall of Knox City 
are paternal grandparents.

Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Saun­
ders, also of Knox City, are 
paternal great-grandparents.

and Watson 2.
The Junior Varsity girls 

also played on January 31 and 
were defeated by Crowell 
37-26. Scoring for KC were 
Albus with 10, Alsides 2, 
Burkham 1, Bateman and 
Helton had 2 each, Johnson 6 
and Reid 3.

Monday night, February 6, 
O’Brien 7th and 8th grade 
boys played Munday 7th and 
8th grade boys and the 8th 
grade girls of O’Brien and the 
8th grade girls of Munday 
and came out winners by a 
score of 28-24.

In the 7th grade boys game 
Stafford was high scorer with 
7 points. Gutierrez, Lankford 
and Guinn had 4 points each, 
Meinzer had 2 and Hutchin­
son 1.

Munday 8th grade boys 
eked by O’Brien 15-10. Scor­
ing for O’Brien were Lerma 
and Rojas with 4 points each 
while Hedgecoke and Hacker 
each scored 1 point.

O’Brien girls were winners 
over Munday 28-24. Hutchin­
son was high pointer for 
O’Brien with 17, White and 
Johnston each made 2 points, 
Garcia had 4 and Rhodes 3.

FROM BRIDGEPORT
Visiting in the home of 

Mrs. Easther May and Mrs. 
Ruby Pierce were Mrs. 
Pierce’s sister-in-law and her 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Chronic of Bridgeport.

P.O. Drawer 9

Wallace Moorhouse Insurance
‘ ‘Your Protection our Profession’ ’

INSURANCE-REAL ESTATE-APPRAISALS-MORTGAGE LOANS 
‘ ‘We are just as close as your telephone. ’ ’
_____  Munday, Texas 76371

OPEN 24 
HOURS

ALLSUPS 
OFFERS 

ORLY THE 
BESTI

AlLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

OPEN 24 
HOURS

SPECIALS 6000 
FEBRUARY 

9 .1 0 .1 U 1 2  
1978

YOU'LL LOVE 
THESE 
AVINGSI

Large, Fresh Grade A

E g g s  do* 5 9 ^

KNOX CITY, TEXAS

FROSTY POPS 
ll $ 119
BOX ■
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Truscott-Gilliland 
News

By MILDRED GLASSCOCK

We had a beautiful snow on 
Jan. 31st, and it was wet. It 
snowed nnost all morning. 
School dismissed early. Jack 
Turner, with Potashnick Co., 
said that was the second day 
they had missed work since 
he started here, on November 
6, which is a very good 
record.

There’s a couple of new 
vehicles around town this 
week. Jackie Brown has a 
rew pickup and Dud Ellis has 
a new car.

I owe an apology to Mr. 
and Mrs. Donnie Packard, 
and not Parker, as I recently 
reported. They are new re­
sidents here, and we are 
happy to have them.

Sybil Simmons picked me 
up on Sunday afternoon and 
we went to Crowell to see 
Aunt Annie Eubank and Edna. 
Curtis Casey also visited with 
them.

Bill Owens spent Wednes­
day to Friday in Knox County 
Hospital, where he was given 
several pints of blood. He was 
in such a hurry to get home 
that he wouldn’t even stay for 
lunch Friday. Tilma and Mac 
McRoberts, of Cisco, came up 
on Thursday for a few days 
visit with Bill and Clara.

Mr. and Mrs. H.R. Green 
of Plains, Kansas came on 
Friday. They spent the night 
with Vivian Brown.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Caram this past weekend 
were Mr. and Mrs. Freddie 
Caram and girls of Munday, 
Lydia and Donna Acosta and 
Leta Ezell of Haltom City.

Tommy Westbrook of Hen­
rietta visited in town on 
Friday.

Virginia Casey, Margaret 
Todd and Sybil Simmons 
attended a meeting of Delta 
Kappa Gamma in Haskell 
Saturday Afternoon.

J.L. and Iva Ruth McBeath 
visited their mothers, Mrs. 
McBeath and Mrs. Butler, in 
Vernon on Sunday; also visit­
ed her brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
Hershell butler who had as 
their guests, Mr. and Mrs. 
Arlie Cato of Fort Worth. Mr. 
Cato worked in the Crowell 
Bank years ago and is a 
former resident of Thalia.

Waylon and Wanda Hardin 
and family of Vera, came to 
visit Geneva and Arnold 
Naveratil Sunday afternoon, 
just in time to catch Geneva 
with a touch of “ something” - 
hope it wasn’t serious Ge­
neva.

Mildred Cook took her 
mother, Lillie Black, to Abi­
lene Friday for an eye check 
up. She wil go back this week 
for eye surgery.

Vivian Brown, Idoma 
Chowning, Berniece Jones 
and Kay Cumley attended a 
meeting of the Columbian 
Club in the home of Mrs. 
Homer Black in Crowell last 
Tuesday afternoon.

Bill and Eva Shiflett, and 
son Matt, of Graham came 
Saturday to spend the night 
with Mrs. Bertha Shaw and 
the Elmo Shaw family.

Lottie Whitaker drove to 
Knox City Saturday afternoon 
to visit Mr. and Mrs. Abe 
Watson.

Winnie Mae and Weldon 
Bailey of Sweeney, Texas 
arrived Wednesday to spend 
some time with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. O.W. Welch. 
Mrs. Welch was admitted to 
the Knox County Hospital 
late Wednesday suffering 
with arthritis. She was much

better by Sunday.
Arnold and Geneva Na­

veratil visited last Thursday 
and Friday with their daugh­
ter, Doris and Ronnie Wilson 
and family in Rising Star. 
They also visited their sister- 
in-law, Lillian Naveratil in 
Breckenridge.

Sue Winstead, of Lubbock, 
spent Wednesday night with 
her folks, Mr. and Mrs. W.T. 
Cook. Sue had spent 2 days in 
Wichita Falls attending and 
FBI Seminar in connection 
with her new job with the 
DPS.

Ha Mae Bullion took her 
mother, Mrs. Summers, and 
her aunt Hattie McEwen, to 
San Angelo on Tuesday to 
visit their sister and other 
relatives. Ha Mae visited her 
sisters, Nadine and Lou Ann.

Ray’s sister. Hazel Ran­
dolph, of Earth, wrote last 
week that their mother, Mae 
Glasscock, who is in a rest 
home in Muleshoe, had cele­
brated her 89th birthday with 
a cake and ice cream party. 
About 15 relatives including 
her daughter and her hus­
band, Laverne and Price Ste­
phenson of Clyde, helped her 
celebrate. Mom is doing bet­
ter than she has in a long 
time.

Joyce and Q.D. Williams of 
Floydada spent Friday night 
with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. E.J. Jones. They were 
en route to Fort Worth to visit 
his brother, Odell Williams, 
who had surgery last week.

Tommy Tapp was in Sey­
mour on business last Friday. 
Allen and Rita Tapp of Can­
yon visited with him on the 
weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Baty 
and sons were in Crowell 
Saturday to help with the 50th 
Anniversary celebration for 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ruel Scott.

June Naveratil, Kathy Car- 
roll, and Geneva Naveratil 
attended the THDA Training 
Meeting in Anson last Mon­
day.

A nice crowd turned out for 
our Friday night get together 
at the Community Center.. 
We enjoye.d-i^eying “ 42”  
and “ Spite^.,,and we also, 
enjoyed the snacks and c0ffee. 
If you missed it Idst w e ^ f bi 
sure and come next wee 
You Gilliland folks come up 
and join us, we’d love to have 
you.

Thank you to everyone who 
has paid on the street lights 
for January thru April. Do­
nors, so far, are Vivian Brown, 
Kay Cumley, Berniece Jones, 
Simpson Hill and Phil Lutz, of 
Corp. of Engineers, Idoma 
Chowning and I.

Jimmy Daniel was home 
from VRJC at Vernon, with 
the flu bug, over the weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Owen New 
v’sited the Jimmy New family 
in Jean on Sunday.

Idoma Chowning attended 
church in Benjamin Sunday 
morning then went to Knox 
City for the Bobby Tankersley 
funeral.

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Casey 
were in Abilene on Monday 
and met Mr. and Mrs. Price 
Stephenson of Clyde for lunch.

A note to folks who have 
been concerned about Mrs. 
Jones-her knee is better, 
especially when she stays off 
of it, but you know Mrs. 
Jones, always going, and 
doing for others.

R MAY WE BE 
YOUR FRIEND?

We try to serve every customer as we would a 
personal friend. O f course we must make a fair I 
profit but we consider your opinion of our 
pharmacy equally important.

You can always get your favorite product for we I 
carry a complete stock. Prices will always be 
justifiably fair, but most important, you will like 
our friendly service. Visit us soon. You will bc| 
welcomed.

“A GREAT MANY PEOPLE ENTRUST U S | 
w ith  their prescriptions, health needs and other I 
pharm acy products. We consider this trust a 
privilege and a duty. May w e be your personal | 
fam ily pharm acy?” I

JONESP harm acy
■TMOirmri«ox cmr. TEXAS,

Kf Colored 
News-tvents

HELP
Somebody, I want to go 

some where any where I sure 
would enjoy going to town 
just to see what going on. 
This is one thing I can’t 
hardly handle, but you no I 
will ride this out if it kill me 
(laugh) I wonder what about 
the ground hog or is it dog? 
Anyway this is what I want to 
no. Did he or didn’t he see his 
shadow? Say everybody did 
you no that Easter is the 4th 
Sunday in March (how about 
that), I hope I can see the 
bunny don’t you think that I 
can, don’t you?

I didn’t get to Sunday 
School and church service 
Sunday, but it were reported 
to me as being very good 
Sunday large attendance and 
a very spiritful morning ser­
vice. Because of the weather 
the church let the pastor go 
home. No night service.

When some one stop by to 
see us Beatrice and me it ’s 
sure make me feel gdod. 
There were other thing that 
made me feel good, and that 
were when Billye Bess call 
me. Things like that is 
friendship. I can’t get over 
how nice people have been to 
me. I feel I am so bless to 
have friends and when you 
are a shut in that when a true 
friend will come through.

SERVICES OF THE 
CHURCH OF GOD 
IN CHRIST

The fifth Sunday Mission 
Joint Meeting was held at the 
Goree Church in January.

Elder George Blue, pastor 
of the Munday Church con­
ducted a revival at the Knox 
City Church five nights of last 
week.

Monday night he preached 
from Numbers 20:17 and 
Isaiah 35:8, “ Stay On The 
Highway.”  Tuesday night 
Joshua 3, “ We Haven’t Been 
This Way Here Before.”  
Wednesday night, “ The 
Right Spirit”  from Psalms 
51:10, Isaiah 11 and Isaiah 
61:1, on Thursday night Mat­
thew 12:38, 43, “ A Greater 
Than Solomon,”  and on Fri­
day night Proverbs 24:10,
' Don . ~aint.”

The Purity,^CIass had choir 
practice and Sunshine.’ Band 
was held on Saturday evening.

Sunday School had a fair 
attendance with Supt. Smith 
irr charge.'^.
'^ |s tgrj|^anue l taught the 

less'on'ffHbe morning service.
The Joint Meeting

was lleld ’Yat the Knox City 
Church Sunday evening. El­
der George Blue preached 
from Mark 4 “ Let Us Go To 
The Other Side.”

The Abilene District Con­
vocation will cd'rjr̂ êne Feb­
ruary 13 at the Bethel Church 
in Abilene, Lord’s Willing.

We share the grief with the 
families that have lost loved 
ones. You have our prayers.

News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home
By MRS. EDNA EUBANK

' "1 ' ■ I ‘ T ^€dl

The Baptist Church of 
Benjamin held services last 
Sunday. The senior citizens 
look forward to having church 
at the home since it is 
impossible for them to attend 
church..

Thanks so much, folks, for 
your thoughtfulness.

Mrs. Williamson enjoyed 
having Clifford, Mr. and Mrs. 
Horace Finley, Ozelle Ste­
phens and Lou Sikes.

The Baptist Church of 
Knox City conducts Sunday 
School each Sunday. Those 
who attend look forward to 
being there.

Mrs. King enjoyed a visit 
from her daughter and hus­
band Mr. and Mrs. James 
Hewitt of Plainview.

Bill Aldridge was glad to

Lions Club 
News

By Z.l. Smith

There were no visitors and 
attendance was down at 
Wednesday’s meeting. Pre­
sident Patterson announced a 
new member drive for the 
month of January, February 
and March. Those bringing m 
one new member will receive 
a lapel pin from International 
and those bringing in two or 
more new members will re­
ceive a desk set. The presi­
dent saw this fine pen set 
when he attended Mid-Win­
ter Conference at Graham 
last Saturday. The Boss Lion 
also reminded all Lions to 
begin making plans to attend 
the District Convention in 
Wichita Falls on May 5 and 6.

The annual Lions Donut 
Sale will be held on Friday, 
February 24, if all plans can 
be made. Lions David Lorenz 
and Randy Coale will pick up 
the donuts and bring to Knox 
City in time for the sale to 
begin early.

The president announced 
that nearly $3,000 in swim­
ming pool bonds are still 
outstanding.

There were other an­
nouncements made and the 
club dismissed with the 
Pledge of Allegience.

see his wife Betty Jo who had 
been in the hospital in Abi­
lene.

Jose Rojas passed away. 
Jose was a model patient and 
we all miss him. Condolences 
to his family.

Mrs. King was returned to 
the hospital last week. Hurry 
and get well Mrs. King, we 
miss you.

Mr. Dabney went to the 
hospital. We hope the best 
for you, Mr. Dabney.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Moon of 
Arlington were here to see 
Mrs. Hodges. Ethel visited 
others while here, too. Bill 
Aldridge and Mrs. Beasley 
were some of them.

Mr. Waldrip had company. 
Some of his callers were 
Jessie Teague, Cheryl Ur- 
banczyk of Munday, Mar­
garet Ann Hill, also of Mun­
day, Allene Waldrip, Rev. 
Randolph Wilson and wife of 
Haskell, and Mrs. Gladys 
Stephens and Ford Waldrip 
and wife Flossie.

Ruth Underwood of 
O’Brien called on her sister 
Zeola Corley.

Eda Fay Pounds spent the 
day of the first in Rochester. 
Her aunt, Bessie, brought 
herhome and visited her sis­
ter, Florence.

Mrs. Hill enjoyed having 
Elaine Gulley of Munday.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Warren 
were up to see her dad, Mr. 
Roberts.

Mrs. Chandler welcomed 
her daughter, Mrs. Hollis.

McClatchy Appointed 
To Advisory Council

OIney Savings’ President 
and Chief and Executive Of­
ficer D.D. McClatchy has 
been appointed to serve as a 
member of the Federal 
Savings and Loan Advisory 
Council, the advisory body to 
the Federal Home Loan Bank 
Board, Washington, D.C., 
Robert H. McKinney, chair­
man of the Federal Home 
Loan Bank Board in Wash­
ington, recently announced.

The Federal Savings and 
Loan Advisory Council con­
sists of twenty-four members, 
one from each of the twelve 
Bank Districts, and twelve 
appointed public interest 
members. The Advisory 
Council meets three times a 
year in Washington to formu­
late policy and regulatory 
recommendations which are 
presented to the Federal 
Home Loan Bank Board for 
consideration.

McClatchy, in accepting 
the appointment, told Chair­
man McKinney, “ The 
Federal Savings and Loan 
Advisory Council serves a 
unique capacity for the sav­
ings and loan industry, and 
for housing in America. I look 
forward to serving on this 
Council with a great amount 
of enthusiasm.”

The first meeting will be 
held in early spring in Wash­
ington, D.C.

January Weather Summary T i

SUNDAY VISITORS
Visiting in the home of Mr. 

and Mrs. J.C. Eaton and 
family Sunday were Sgt. and 
Mrs. Jay Eaton, Jay Bob and 
Jessica of Lacey, Washington, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Eaton 
and Jeremy Chris of Graham, 
Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Eaton, 
Mrs. Vivian Joplin, Robin 
and Stacy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Donnie Eaton, Dale Wayne 
and La Donna, all of Rotan, 
Mr. and Mrs. Abe Busch, 
Rickey, Tana and Roger, 
Mrs. Audry Dyess of Graham, 
Gary Eaton of Abilene, Felix 
Garcia of O’Brien, and Mrs. 
LaUna Hester of Lubbock.

The group celebrated Jay 
Bob’s birthday and welcomed 
home the newest member of 
the family, Jeremy Chris 
Eaton, who was born January 
24.

C iM iA ie iu e H  AVIATION

"Providing A Service"
Home [817] 4224186 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 76371
Munday Airport 4224536 

Knox City Airport 658 3716

Bus Is Almost Full! Better Hurry!

Ride the Chartered Bus 

To The

Grapevine Opry
[Country - Western & Gospel]

Saturday, Feb. 25

$20.00
per person includes bus fare 

and Opry ticket

. Bus departs 1:00 P.M.
From KC News Office

All Reservations and Money Must Be In News Office 
By Noon Friday, Feb. 10

Sponsored By

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS

%

January. 1978 was much 
cooler and drier than normal. 
Temperatures fur the month 
averaged 33.60 degrees F 
which is 7.1 degrees below 
the 12 year average (1966- 
1977) but only 0.64 degrees 
cooler than last year’s Jan­
uary average of 34.24 degrees. 
The warmest temperature re-

It Pays To 
Advertise

corded was 77 degrees on the 
fifth and the lowest was 12 '
degrees on the tenth. There 
were six days during the 
month in which the daytime 
temperature was not higher , 
than 32 degrees.

Moisture for the month 
totaled only .48 inches which 
is .49 inches below the 12 
year average of .97 inches. 
1.28 inches was received in 
January of 1377. Only 4.01 
inches of precipitation has 
been received since June 1, 
1977.

Dance At Rhineland Gym
SATURDAY NIGHT, FEB. 11

Dick Proctor 
And The Siiver Spur

FASTEST RISING BAND IN THE SOUTHWEST
VERSATILE DANCE BAND

We play your favorite
A Little Bit County... A Little Bit Rock 

A Little Bit Jazz
9 to 1 Adm. $4.00

Haskell Woman 
Artist Of Month

Each month a member ot 
the Brazos West Art Club is 
chosen as “ Artist of the 
Month”  and her art is exhib­
ited for the public to see. 
Artist of the Month for Feb­
ruary is Mrs. R.W. Merchant 
of Haskell. The Brazos West 
Art Club is comprised of four 
counties, which includes 
Knox.

Due to the generousity of 
the Citizens State Bank, and 
to encourage the Brazos Art 
Club, the work of the Artist of 
the Month is put on display in 
the beautiful foyer of the 
bank.

The public is extended a 
cordial invitation to go by the 
bank and see the art on 
display by Mrs. Merchant.

When your 
water system  

lets you 
) down. . .

C A L L

YOUR JACUZZI DEALER!

LYNN ELECTRIC MOTOR CO.
Knox City Phone 658-3511

DINNER GUESTS
Sunday dinner guests in 

the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
John McCown were their son, 
Jerry of Western Texas Col­
lege in Snyder, Paula San­
dusky, and Jerry King and 
son Kurt of Stamford.

R eddy T ip s  
To H e lp \b u ...

% S T ^ T C H ^

Dollar$

Use your 
Refrigerator Wisely...

Open and close the refrigerator and freezer doors 
only when necessary. Several items can be removed 
at once to reduce loss of cold air.

^  Freezers and refrigerators operate most efficiently 
when filled to the correct capacity. Foods should 
be placed slightly apart on refrigerator shelves for 
correct circulation.

Cover all liquids stored in the refrigerator (espe­
cially frost-free models). Moisture is drawn into 
the air from uncovered liquids making the refriger­
ator work harder.

Be sure your appliance is standing level so that 
the door seals properly. By setting a glass of water 
on the top, you can see if it is level.

Pick up your FREE copy of 
“ ENERGY CONSERVATION”

Booklet from

m i ]  Fk'igidaire
Home Environment Division of General Motors.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

A Mvinlu'T (»1 riu' L «tiul South VVt»si Svsit*m
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GROUND BEEF
Round Steak
Ham Slices

CENTER CUT

C H U C K  R O AS T
Family Steak
SIRLOIN STEAK
MARYLAND CLUB

COFFEE
98

Pound Can ^
J i j { i { i i i i j { j l j j j i { i i j { | l l j j j j j j j i i j j { j { { j j { iu

u P T o i i  
IN S T A N T

T E A
3 ox. Ja r

JON THESE FOOD VALUES

c^>

COOKIE MIX
CHOCOLATE CHIP 

SUGAR OATMEAL
PEANUT BUTTER

SPAM
LUNCHEON 

MEAT
12-Oz.
Con

K R A F T ’S

BIG SAVINGS
PURINA h i-pro  0

DOG CHOW
25 IB. BAG REGULAR $6.49

CAMPBELL'S
48 OZ.

CRISCO OIL
_ $ -l9 9

^ 'P t o n  ' t ea $ 1 6 9
i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i ii ii ii iii ii ii ii ii iii ii ii ii iR

AMERICAN
BEAUTY

10-oz.
S H E L L  OR  PKGE, 

ELBOW

CHICKEN
NOODLE

SOUP

A & W
SUGAR FREE 

or
REGULAR

ROOT BEER
6 ’ 2 - 0 ,

A
18 OZ.

GRAPE 
JELLY 6 9 ^

EATWELL

MACKEREL
4 9 t15-Oz

Cans

Merton

MINI -  DONUTS

lO-Oi- PLg-

BANQUET
Chicken-Beef-

FftliM FRISH FRUITS & VEGITAByS

Cans

MACARONI

GLAOIOLA

POUCH MIXES
,100Pkgs

BATHROOM 79* 
TISSUE bathroom tissue 

4 roll pack, soft 
bathroom tissue 
in white or 
assorted colors,

FACIAL TISSUE

G R A P EFR U IT
“ RURY REDS' 

48-SIZE

GREEN ONIONS

Radishes

2 0 0 - C t .
We Re d e e m

llllllll

NO. 1 R U S S E n
POTATOES

LB. BAB

DOWNY*
FABRIC

SOFTENER

64 OZ.  Bottle

WASHINGTON
DANJOU

[i w  m »

Tide
Detergent

G ia n t
Size

VINE RIPE

TOMATOES
Pound

1 tjt *.** f !

^ 1 2 9  \g S il
B O B ’ S S U P E R  S A V E

Cî ty Temos 79 529



Telephone
Carolyn’s Chatter Excise Tax

Bv CAROLYN SCHUR DfOPS AOdill
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Delta Kappa Gamma 
Meets In Haskell

JO ANNE W HITE, RICKY L. ALLEY
...engaged to wed

Locals’ Kin To Say 
June Vows In Lubbock

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth E. 
White of Lubbock announce 
the engagement and forth­
coming marriage of their 
daughter, Jo Anne, to Lance 
Corporal Ricky L. Alley of 
Camp Pendleton, California.

The prospective bride­
groom is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy L. Alley of Lubbock.

Miss White, a 1974 gra-

GED Tests 
Set Saturday

The General Education 
Development (GED) Tests 
will be given at the Haskell 
Junior High School Official 
Testing Center in Haskell on 
Saturday, February 11, be­
ginning at 9:00 a.m. The fee 
for the battery of five tests is 
$20.00.

The GED Program pro­
vides a means for deter­
mining the educational level 
of adults who have not com­
pleted a formal high school 
education. A certificate of 
high school equivalency may 
be issued to adults who 
successfully complete the 
GED examination, verifying 
that the holder has demon­
strated a level of competence 
on the examination which is 
equivalent to that of a high 
school senior.

The test has five parts; 
Correctness and Effective­
ness of Expression, Interpre­
tation of Reading Materials 
in the Social Studies, Inter­
pretation of Reading Mater­
ials in the Natural Sciences, 
Interpretation of Literary 
Materials, and General 
Mathematics Ability. The test 
questions are multiple choice. 
There is no time limitation 
but most examinees take 
approximately eight hours to 
complete the test batterv.

Persons eligible for testing 
must:

-be a resident of Texas or a 
member of the Armed Forces 
stationed in Texas;

-be at least 17 years of age 
and officially withdrawn from 
school for one calendar year. 
(Applicants who have attain­
ed their 17th birthday and 
will enter the Armed Forces 
may test immediately after 
withdrawing from school;

-be 18 years of age and 
officially withdrawn from 
school.

To receive a certificate of 
high school equivalency, the 
examinee must:

-complete the examination 
with a minimum standard 
score of 40 on each of the five 
tests OR an average standard 
score of 45 on all five tests;

-have attained at least their 
17th birthday prior to date of 
testing and be out of school 
for one calendar year;

-have attained their 18th 
birthday and be officially 
withdrawn from school.

Applicants must wait six 
months before retesting. If 
the applicant is tutored by a 
certified teacher or partici­
pates in an adult education 
program, retesting may occur 
when the instructor deter­
mines the applicant is pre­
pared.

Applicants are advised to 
bring their Social Security 
number and their driver’s 
license as proper identifica­
tion.

It Pays To 
Advertise

duate of Lubbock Coronado 
High School, is also a gra­
duate of Commercial Busi­
ness College. She is presently 
employed by the Computer 
Center at Texas Tech Univer- 
sitv

Alley is also a 1974 gra­
duate of Lubbock Coronado 
High School. He is currently 
serving in the U.S. Marine 
Corp and is stationed at 
Camp Pendleton.

The couple is planning a 
June wedding at the Memor­
ial Baptist Church in Lubbock.

The Whites are former 
Knox City residents. Jo Anne 
is the granddaughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. J.O. Buchanan.

ETHNIC HOME 
FURNISHINGS ARE 
NEWEST TREND-SETTERS

The Orient, Egypt, and the 
South Seas are influencing 
home furnishings trends as 
never before. Today, the new 
decors are going ethnic with 
bold patterns, rattan and 
bamboo furniture, accessor­
ies running the gamut from 
lacquered campaign chests to 
straw baskets, and color 
schemes slipping into the 
natural earth shades.

Watch for upholstery fab­
rics, draperies, even towels 
e.nd tablecloths to reflect this 
direction in patterns that 
feature batik florals, basket 
weave prints, animal motifs, 
repetitive small and large 
scale geometries, and mar­
ble-type designs that seem to 
have rubbed off some ancient 
Egyptian temple floor.

Colors go neutral, gray, 
brick red and burnt orange to 
be complemented by soft 
shades of the same hues. 
Blues are turning to teal and 
jade as clear crisp yellow, 
navy, and salmon also get 
attention.

Blending your current de­
corating scheme with these 
trends may be easier than you 
think. The new upholstery 
fabrics are eclectic enough to 
accent most decors, as are the 
new pillows, wall hangings, 
and bamboo, wicker or rattan 
screens.
Basket Accessories

Another important acces­
sory is baskets, in assorted 
shapes and sizes, stacked on 
the floor or hung on the wall 
to add texture and color.

To emphasize the natural 
weave, furniture is going 
toward the wicker, rattan, 
and bamboo or turning to the 
ever popular chrome and 
glass which serves as a man-

Ellen Neely On Dean’s List
Ellen Neely, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Spurgeon 
Neely of Rochester, was 
named to the Dean’s List at

Lowry To Address 
Knox City 4-H ’ers

The Knox City 4-H Club 
will hold a meeting, Monday 
evening, February 13, at the 
Community Center. The 
meeting is scheduled to begin 
at seven o’clock with State 
Gamewarden Vic Lowry pre­
senting the program on hunt­
ing and gun safety.

According to a spokesman 
for the group, all members 
are urged to attend.

Vernon Regional Junior Col­
lege last semester.

The 1977 Rochester High 
School honor grad had a 3.6 
grade average out of a possi­
ble 4.0

Ellen is majoring in ele­
mentary education.

Call In Your News 
658-3142

KC Women In 
Capping Ceremony

Three Knox City women, 
Eulalia Hearn, Donna Burt, 
and Algerine Logsdon, will 
participate in capping cere­
monies from Vocational 
Nursing School Friday, Feb­
ruary 10.

The ceremonies are to be 
held in the First Baptist 
Church in Seymour and are 
scheduled to begin at 7:30 
p.m.

Valentine Plants

\ r i
Gloxinia Azaleas

$5.00 per pot [6 in.]
1:00 to 3:00 p.m. weekdays

Horticulture Class

SHOP AND SAVE AT

LI  ̂m
r ia iy a ic i  »

802 EAST MAIN

Weekend Speidais
Good Thurs. - Fri. - Sat

We reserve right to limit.
Maryland Club

C O f f O G  1 Lb. Can $2.89
August Pies 8/$1
1 Gal. Plastic Jug

Preston Milk $1.65
C r i S C O  3 Lb. Can $1.59
Minnesota Certified Grade 1

Seed Potatoes p., ioo $12.00
Large Selection

ONION PLANTS - GARDEN SEED
Northrop King & Ferry-M orse
Magazines-TV Guides-Softback Books
WE ACCEPT U.b. FOOD STAMPS

made complement.
Table settings can benefit 

from the ethnic influence with 
napkins and cloths sporting 
these patterns and colors. 
Additionally new spark can 
touch the arrangement with 
baskets of flowers, bamboo- 
patterned glasses in straw 
caps, and silverware with 
wooden handles.

This season let your ima­
gination travel to another 
time and place, drawing from 
cultures that speak of a 
richness, that is so natural it 
fits almost everyone’s taste. 
ROMANTIC DRESSING 
FOR SPRING ’78 

Romance sets the mood! 
Think innocent....soft,... 

sweet....
Design Details... 
.drawstrings
.dolman, loose or puffed 

sleeves
.fluttery necklines 
.ruffles, pleating, tucks 
.Pierrot or shawl collars 
Flirty trim ....
.lace insets, applique 
.ribbons, bows 
.delicate embroidery 
•faggoting
Soft garment silhouettes.... 
.slimmed pant legs 
• bare and tropical sun­

dresses
.peasant dresses 
.loosely constructed blaz­

ers, jackets and sportswear 
.frilly blouses 
circular, full, tiered or 

pleated skirts 
■blouson blouses, dresses 
Additional touches 
.natural hemp to puckered 

silk
.crystal drip jewelry 
.ceramic bangles, discs 
.embroidered handker­

chiefs
.flowers at the neck, waist, 

in the hair
.lower heel sandals, moc­

casins

A one percent reduction 
doesn’t sound like much of a 
savings, but when Uncle Sam 
lowered the excise tax on 
telephone bills another one 
percent during 1977, that 
amounted to a savings of over 
$2,893,000 for General Tele­
phone Company of the 
Southwest customers.

The excise tax is levied on 
local and long distance ser­
vices with the telephone 
company simply collecting 
the tax for the government.

General Telephone collect­
ed almost $14,500,000 in 
excise taxes from its custom­
ers during 1977 at the five 
percent tax levy. The tax was 
six percent during 1976 and 
during 1978 has been reduced 
to four percent.

The 1978 reduction is the 
sixth in a 10-year elimination 
of the tax. The tax will 
continue to drop one percent 
each year until it expires Jan. 
1, 1982 unless Cong''ess a- 
dopts a recent proposal to 
accelerate elimination of the 
tax.

Ladies Deliver 
To Vernon Center

Mrs. Selma Word and Mrs. 
Gladys Stephens were in 
Vernon Monday to deliver a 
load of clothes to the Vernon 
Center.

Mrs. Stephens reported 
that the superintendent, Mrs. 
Spears, was very appreciative 

. of the items donated and also 
stressed that the Center was 

;in need of paperback books 
and women’s shoes size ten 
or larger.

She also expressed a spe­
cial thanks to the Knox City 
folk for their donations and 
concern.

The Beta Chi Chapter of 
Delta Kappa Gamma met 
Saturday, February 4, at 2:30 
p.m. in the Bank Community 
Room in Haskell. Hostesses 
for the monthly meeting were 
Haskell members.

The meeting was opened 
with group singing of the 
Delta Kappa Gamma song. 
Sammie Carpenter directed 
the singing with Mary Martin 
accompaning at the piano.
, Mrs. Virginia Casey, music 
chairman, introduced Sonia 
Carter and her mother, Mrs. 
Terry Carter of Knox City. 
Sonia, a Knox City High 
School junior, sang two num-

Griffith-Carver 
Engagement Told

Mrs. Ross Griffith an­
nounces the engagement and 
approaching marriage of her 
daughter, Virginia Anne, to 
Ricky T. Carver, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Carver of 
Benjamin.

Miss Griffith is a 1977 
graduate of Knox City High 
School and the prospective 
bridegroom is a senior stu­
dent at Benjamin High School.

The wedding is planned for 
Saturday, February 11, in the 
First United Methodist 
Church in Knox City.

bers, “ I ’ ll Get Over You”  and 
‘ ‘You Light Up My Life” .

Program director, Mrs. 
Renella Watson, introduced 
Mrs. Rose Carpenter, Biology 
teacher at Rider High School 
in Wichita Falls as guest 
speaker. Her topic was ‘ ‘Per­
sonal Achievement and Pro­
fessional Recognition” . Mrs. 
Carpenter, also a member of 
the Texas State Board of 
Education, discussed many 
problems concerning ‘ ‘Curri­
culum Planning in the Public 
Schools” .

During the discussion, two 
questions arose ‘ ‘What shall 
we teach?”  and ‘ ‘How shall 
we tjach to get best results 
for our students?”

Chapter president Hazel 
Long directed the business 
meeting.

Members of the organiza­
tion enjoyed an interesting 
roll call beginning with the 
words, ‘ ‘ I have served

Merri Clarke On 
Tech’s Dean’s List

The News office has been 
notified that Merri Clarke, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
C.G. Clarke of Knox City, has 
been named to the dean’s 
honor roll at Texas Tech 
University in Lubbock.

To qualify for the dean’s 
honor roll, a student must 
have a grade point average of 
3.0 or more on a 4.0 scale and 
must have taxen as many as 
12 semester hours of work.

Send Our FTD

LoveBundle”
B ouquet

=K=

KC Garden Club 
To Meet Tuesday

The Knox City Garden 
Club will meet Tuesday af­
ternoon, February 14, at two 
o’clock in the Community 
Center.

Roll call will be answered 
to ‘ ‘A bird I have seen this 
month” .

Reporter for the club, Mrs. 
Ruby Robinson, provided this 
verse to club members, ‘ ‘The 
habits of each little bird, and 
all its patient skill, are surely 
taught by God Himself, and 
ordered by His W ill”

Mrs. W illie Geer announ­
ced that Marie Ward would 
be guest speaker for the 
March 4 meeting in Asper- 
mont.

Refreshments of cherry 
tarts, roasted pecans, olives, 
and coffee were served to 
twenty-eight members and 
three guests.

Knox City members pre­
sent were Lois Smith, Mary 
Jo Lankford, Hazel Long, 
Sudia Cash, Sammie Carpen­
ter, Mary Beth Smith, Zoy 
Risinger, Renella Watson, 
and Lillian Logan.

OMISSION
In last week’s Card of 

Thanks from the family of 
Mrs. Nettie McAda, the 
name of Floyd McAda inad­
vertently was omitted.

The News 
this oversite.

office regrets

Fresh, romantic 
flowers arranged with a 
spray of sparkling 
hearts. We can send it 
almost anywhere by 
wire, the FTD way.
But hurry.. .Valentine's 
Day is Tuesday, 
February 14!
$15.00
and up

'We really get around... for you!"

-ALSO-

CORSAGES 
ARRANGEMENTS 

CUT FLOWERS 
PLANTS

Place Your Orders Early 
For Best Selection.

KNOX CITY  
FLORIST

R58<3581

=a<=

Engraved or Printed

Photo Invitations 
Also Available

Prompt service. . . . , 

Reasonable prices

FREE
Beautiful Wedding Tray 

if your order totals 
$30. 00 or more 

If purchased separately 
$4. 00

We also have
WEDDIII6 BOOKS

PERSONALIZED NOTES & STATIONERY 
WiTHIN THE-RIBBON CARDS 

V AT HOME CARDS

:

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS
Knox City
V —»
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DO UBLE
S & H GREEN STAMPS 

WEDNESDAYS
With Ihe Putthiie 
Ot S2 50 Ot Mote

SPECIALS GOOD 
THDR..FRI.,SAT., 
FEB. 9-10-11

W E  H A V E  A N  E X C E L L E N T  
S U P P L Y  O F  V A L E N T I N E
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B R E A S T S

See Us 
N o w  

While 
Supply Is 

Complete!!

DEL MONTE

T O M A T O
SA U C E

tMlRonW

D i n n e r  / C O
P la te  O y
B O M S W I.l K rm sW KFK

2 Pc. Soup j

4.99
.......V-

8 OZ. 
CANS

D E L  M O N T E  G O L D E N

i o n *
* W h o i e  Ke rn e l  
*Cream Style

DEL MONTE

SWEET PEAS 
3
303 

CANS

303
CANS

.^Piniontp,

BEEF FRANKS
p * 6 .

S M O K E D  
P O R K  

C H O P S

FROZEN

9  i SST.KINDS D IN N ER S
Fo r

V a n Q m p ^

WOLF CHILI

VAN C A M P ' S

PORK & 
I BEANS
3

Shurfresh

Sweet Milk
G A L L O N  P L A S T I C  J U G HOT I HKS

lb.
16-OZ.CANS

N 0 .2
C AN

NICE 'N 
S O F l

D EL M O N T E JUICE
P I N E A P P L E - G R A P E F R U I T

46 - O Z .
CAN

T O ILET  TISSUE

4  "  6 9 t

3
DETERGENT PLUS 
FABRIC SOFTENER

4 9 - O Z .  BOX

FRUIT COCKTAIL,
2 8 8 f

Shur­
fresh

ante

CANS

5 9 «
BISCUITS

4 1 0 0CANS

I  T i
T O M A T O E S

FR ESH

8 4 - O Z .  BOX

2 .2 9

TOTINO'S
PIZZA

ASST. FLAVORS 
EACH 89c

1 A.F. Canned
1 H A M S  'oS $4.99

ZEE
NAPKINS

COUNTRY 
GARDEN 

140-CT. PKG. 58c
HAR
SPNAY

AQUA-NET 
13-OZ. CAN 
1.03 VALUE E l

MAAIOX
LIQUID

12-OZ. BOTTLE 
1.74 VALUE $149

■I

GRAPEFRUIT

t

R U B Y  R ED  
5 -L B . BAG

7 9 <

C EN T R A L A M E R IC A N

BANANAS^
I 9 <  ^Ih.

A L L
PURPOSE
RUSSET

POTATOES
8 9 *1 0 -L B .

BAG

I  a  ^ .1K
i - t l l

t i i A


