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Phillips Service 
Held Saturday

Funeral services for Mrs. Mf 
tie M. Phillips, widow of Dr. V 
R. Phillips of Pattonville, wer 
held at 3 p. m. Saturday in Pat 
tonville Baptist Church with thi 
Rev, James Barnes and the Rev. 
Jerry Moore officiating. Buria 
wa- in Highland Cemetery, De­
port.

X ,.llhearers were grandsons, 
Bob Young, Jon Young, Budd 
McDowra, Reginald McDowra 
Mickey McDowra. Billy Bob Ricp 
James W. Rice and W ayr' 
Moore. Mrs. Phillips died Thur.~ 
day in Pleasant Grove Nursing 
Home.

She was born Oct 19, 1880, ir. 
Lamar County, a daughter of th‘ 
late T. Y. and Ellen (Crain 
Johnston. She attended Patton­
ville school.s and married \V. R 
Phillips on Nov. 2. 1898. at Roh\ 
Dr. Phillips attended medico 
school in Nashville, Tenn., a:i 
he and his wife returned to La­
mar County settling at Garrett’s 
Bluff. They moved to Minter in 
1900 and to Pattonville in 1918 
Dr. Phillips’ death Occurred on 
Sept. 20, 194G.

She was a member o f the Pat­
tonville Baptist Church

Survivors include six daugh­
ters; Mrs. Lois .Moore of Clarer 
don, Mrs. Louise Rice o f Rtrc 
Mrs. Mildred P. Young of Pat­
tonville, Mrs. Doris Itoberts i 
Deport, Mrs. Dorthea Woodso: 
o f Pattonville and Mrs. Robbye 
Cutting o f Danielson. Conn.; 23 
grandchildren, 46 great-grand­
children and four great-great­
grandchildren. Also surviving 
are two sisters, Mrs. Oma Low 
o f Lorenzo and Mrs. Edythe 
Thompson of Santa Rosa, Tex.: 
and a brother, Clifton Johnston 
o f  Belton. A son, Weldon Phil­
lips, precered her in death in 1929

Ross W. Warren 
Dies After Qlness

MRS. HOWARD READ 
DIES IN ARKANSAS

LOCAL NEWS

William N. Skeen 
Services Tuesday

Ross W. Warren of Milton 
died Tuesday night at 10:30 at 
McCuistion Hospital, Paris, where 
he had been a patient since Fri­
day night. Funeral services were 
set for Thursday at 2:00 p. m. at 
Pattonville Baptist Church with 
the Revs. James Barnes. Jerry 
Moore and Byron Holt officiat­
ing. Grant Funeral Home to 
make burial in Halesboro Ceme­
tery.

Mr. Warren, son of Henry and 
Ella (Rains) Warren, was born 
May 29. 1908 at Clarksville. He 
married the former Johnnie Al­
len January 7, 19.34. She sur­
vives; also a half-brother, R. B. 
Johnson o f Beeville and these 
step-sisters and brothers; Mrs. W. 
K. Ceiba. Mrs. J. W. Stevens, 
Kenneth Frazier and Billy Fraz­
ier o f Victoria.

Mrs. Morris Fisher was noti­
fied Sunday o f the death o f her 
aunt, Mrs. Howard Read of Lit­
tle Rock, Ark. She died Saturday 
night. Mrs. Read was the sister 
o f the late Tom Massingill. She 
is survived by four children. Bur­
ial was made in Arkan.sas Tues­
day afternoon.

Mrs. Ottis Hall is a patient in 
a Mt. Pleasant ho.spital.

Funeral services were held 
Tuesday at 2 p. m. in First United 
Methodist Church, Deport, for 
William N. Skeen who was dead 
on arrival at Deport Medical 
Clinic at 8:30 Sunday morning. 
Lev. Gary Lindley officiated at 
the service and Grant Funeral 
Home made burial in Meadow- 
brook Cemetery. Pallbearers 
were George Grant, Fred Swint 
Jr., Wesley Wright, Karl Kim­
ball, Therb Thomas and Marvin 
Hobbs.

Mr. Skeen was born Sept. 10, 
1900. son of John Martin and 
Mary H. (Burchinal) Skeen. He 
is survived by a sister. Miss Lena 
Marie Skeen of Lubbock.

William Skeen attended school 
at Deport and a Ft. Worth high 
school and Kemper Military Aca­
demy at Boonville. Mo. He was 
a farmer and rancher and live­
stock raiser in the Deport area 
all his life. He was one of the 
larger producers o f hay and feed 
crops and took great interest i:i 
boys clubs and FFA activities. 
Up until the last few weeks he 
had owned and operated large 
acreage in Lamar and Red River 
Counties. He was in the process 
of selling liis land, horses and cat­
tle and retiring. He was a mem­
ber o f Dejioit Volunteer Fire De­
partment for many years and 
took part in many activitie.s for 
the betterment of the community. 
He wa.s a hunter and sportsman.

Book Lovers Club 
Elects Officers

Mrs. J. H. Weathcrall was hos­
tess to the Book Lovers Club at 
a called meeting for the purpose 
of electing officers. Contributing 
to the Titus County ambulance 
fund was discussed. Mrs. Dick 
Rodgers was accepted as a new 
member.

All the same officers were re­
elected. They are: president.
Mrs. J. H. VVeatherall; vice pres., 
Mrs. E. W. Smith; sec.-treas., 
Mrs. T. L. Barton; asst, sec.- 
treas., Mrs. B. L. Gieger; report­
er, Mrs. O. B. Hopwood.

Refreshments were served by 
Mrs. Weatherall and club ad­
journed until next October.

FUNDS NEEDED FOR 
McCRURY CEMETERY

Mowing time is here and funds 
for the upkeep of the McCrury 
Cemetery are needed. If you are 
interested in this please contact 
Mr .and Mrs. Leroy Lewis or de­
posit the money to the McCrury 
Cemetery account at the Bogata 
bank.

SINGING CONVENTION 
JOHNTOWN WEEK END
The Red River County Singing 
Convention will meet at the John- 
town Baptist Church Saturday 
night, May 19 and Sunday May 
20. Sunday singing will start at 
10:30 a. m. Gene Lampard of 
Lone Star is president and Ray­
mond Mauldin of Bogata, vice 
president.

Mr. and Mrs. Olen Williams 
went to Ft. Worth Monday to be 
with the Gains Robinson family 
after the death o f Mrs. Robinson.

Mr. and Mrs. Chris W’addell of 
Denton visited their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dured Hall and Mr. and 
Mrs. A. C. VV.Tddell during the 
week end.

Elmer Luttrell came home 
Monday after a stay in the St. 
Joseph’s Hospital. Paris.

Mrs. Cora Cooper has been dis­
missed from the Titus County 
Memorial Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Mankins, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Russell. Creg 
and Jerilynn and Mrs. Ivy Smith 
visited their mother and grand­
mother. Mrs. Willie Mankins. 
Sunday.

Mrs. R. V. Parker is a surgical 
patient in the Methodist Hospital 
in Dallas.

Mrs. Lucille Whitney has been 
a patient in the Mt. Pleasant 
Hospital and Clinic.

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Heard 
and children of Dallas and Mr. 
and Mrs. J. E. Waldrum and fam­
ily were Mother’s Day guests of 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jess 
Waldrum.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Jones at­
tended funeral services of his 
aunt. Mrs. Gains Robinson in Ft. 
Worth. Tuesday.

Saturday visitors in the home 
o f Mr. and Mrs. D. A. Neeley 
were their daughter, Mrs. Dale 
Simpson and Stevie of Longview 
and Mrs. Simpson’s daughter, 
Mrs. Glenda Sweat of Au‘:ti9.

Mr. and Mrs. Duane Welch and 
girls from Pasadena visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. E. 
during the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Simmons of 
Denison spent Sunday with his 
brother and wife. Mr. and Mrs. 
Got don Simmons.

Michael Waldrum. small son of 
Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Waldrum is 
a pneumonia patient in the hos­
pital at Omaha.

Austin. — Daring more federal 
court challenges, the House Re- 
apportionment Committee has 
advanced a “ redistricting” bill 
that makes virtually no changes 
in present representative dis­
tricts.

The Committee bill, approved 
12-8, would retain multi-member 
House districts in all but the 
three metropolitan counties of 
Bexar. Dallas and Harris.

Rep. Joe Wyatt of Blooming­
ton, the sponsor, said he would 
accept an amendment on the 
House floor to give Tarrant 
County single-member districts 
like those in the three larger 
counties.

Chairman Rep. Fred Head o f 
Troup favored dividing all urban 
counties, which now have two or 
more representatives, into single­
member districts. Committee ac­
tion, in effect, took control of 
the bill from Head on the floor

A three-judge federal court in 
January, 1972, ordered single- 
member House districts for Bex­
ar and Dallas counties and gave 
the legislature until July 1 to 
rewrite a 1791 reapportionment 
scheme.

Representatives were warned 
before the vote that if the U. S. 
Supreme Court upliolds the lL-72 
ruling, it is likely to order single 
member, individual House dis­
tricts in all urban counties.

The bill as advanced further 
did not meet federal court disap­
proval of a 9.9 per cent popula­
tion spiead between s:iiallest and 
most-populous Texas House dis­
tricts.

However, Wyatt contended the 
Supreme Court in a Virginia 
case later upheld a 16.4 per cent 
deviation.

U NN ECESSA RY “ EN ERGV” 
ADS —  The House Natural Re­
sources Committee held a hear­
ing on HSR 131 last week — a 
measure that requests advertis­
ers to “ not use advertisements to 
urge the public to use more pow­
er or energy than is reasonably 
necessary.”

Hou.se authors are Representa­
tives Ben Grant, Marshall, and 
Wood Denson, Houston.

Grant testified before the 
Committee that his bill was not 
intended to regulate advertising 
of energy companies in Texas — 
but to urge advertisers to “ teach 
or persuade the public to con­
serve or decrease the use of en­
ergy and to avoid all waseful uses 
of power.”

He cited some of the copy used 
by Conn Edison — a major util­
ity in the East.

A spokesman for the Southwest 
Electric Power Company told the 
Committee that his company was 
against the bill because they did 
not feel the state should “ get into 
the business of curtailing adver­
tising ”

“ We have a surplus of power,” 
he said. “ Conn Edoson has a 
shortage. We need to urge our 
consumers to use more electricity 
in the winter for heating pur­
poses. We have the power avail­
able, and we need to sell it in or­
der to pay for our bonds.”

“ Our consumers use our power 
supply in the summer when air 
conditioning is needed,” he con­
tinued. “ But we need to ‘sell’ 
them on winter-time power con­
sumption through our advertis­
ing programs. We don’t think 
the state legislature should get 
into advertising controls in Tex- 
as.“

Grant said he was merely try­
ing to encourage advertisers to 
avoid waste of energy, and that 
he would Oppose “ mandatory” 
regulations also.

The bill was sent to the Oil and 
Gas subcommittee of the Natural 
Resources Committee.

VENDING MACHINE FIRMS 
EYED — The attorney general’s 
office and 14 other government 
agencies are investigating oper­
ations of 11 vending machine cor­

porations in five cities.
Visiturial letters were served on 

the firms requesting that books 
and records be made available for 
inspection.

The Department o f Public Saf­
ety, State Comptroller, State Se­
curities Board, Texas Alcoholic 
Beverage Commission and law 
enforcement agencies in the cit­
ies are cooperating in the probe, 
coordinated by the Attorney 
General’s Organized Crime Strike 
F orce.

Firms are located in Dallas, 
Houston, Fort Worth, Grand 
Prairie and an S.AntoniO.

Details of the investigation 
were not disclosed Refusal o f  
a Grand Prairie concern to allow 
inspection o f records resulted in 
filing a misdemeanor complaint 
in Dallas County Criminal Court
No.
DISA.STER AID AVAILABLE, 

l.lIUiTED — The federal Small 
Business Administration will 
make disaster loans in Hale. Na- 
vano and Frio Counties as a re­
sult of April 15 tornadoes.

Sen. John Tower announced the 
aid, but Governor Briscoe said 
Uie Office of Emergency Pre­
paredness rejected his request to 
declare Hale and Navarro Coun­
ties major disaster areas.

Tower said 15 other counties 
have been declared eligible for 
eineigency loans from Farmers 
Home Administration due to wea­
ther damage including excessive 
rainfall. The counties are Con­
cho, Crisby, El Paso, Franklin, 
Hale, Hockley, Hudspeth, Mont­
gomery, Lamb. Lynn, Lubbock, 
ikceves, Wharton and Wood.

RECORD WHEAT HARVEST 
REPORTED — Agriculture Com­
missioner John C. White report­
ed me Ill's*, wheat harvest o f 1973 
in Frio County averaged 26 bush­
els an acre, a record high.

Tne 'lexas wheat htirveab is 
expeciea to reach 83,L.OU,UOO bush­
els this year, double the 1972 
yield, from d,2UU,UU0 acres, Wnite 
estimated. Major harvest in 
North Texas won’t start until 
late May, and won’t reach a peak 
until June.

AG OPINIONS —  A 13,000 
homestead exemption applies to 
property subject to ad valorem 
taxes lor county farm-to-inarket 
load and flood control purposes, 
but a second resident exemption 
on the same property can’t be 
claimed, Atty. Gen. John Hill 
held

In other recent opinions. Hill 
concluded:

• A  bill allowing the State 
Board of Control to serve as pur­
chasing agent for college dis­
tricts is constitutional.

• Cooperative purchasing 
agreements by local governments 
with the Board of Cotrol or 
among themselves would also be 
constitutional.

• A Commission on Revenue 
Earmarking would be constitu­
tional.

• Metropolitan county sup­
plementation o f Court o f  Crimin­
al Appeals pay would be uncon­
stitutional.

CONVE.NTION D I S C O R D  
K.\iM'..D — Senate planners for 
the 1974 constitutional conven­
tion were angered by House ef­
forts to dominate the arrange­
ments committee.

The House adopted a resolu­
tion calling for 16 members of 
the convention planning commit­
tee and only five senators. Sen­
ate spokesmen said the proposal 
will ever be accepted.

Meanwhile, House Speaker 
Price Daniel Jr. said he docs not 
condone circulation of a petition 
endorsing him as convention 
charman. Both Lt. Gov. Hobby 
and Daniel have acknowledged 
they are interested in the chair­
manship, although they say they 
are not campaigning. Several 
House members have endorsed 
Daniel.

Leon Sikes, former Talco resi­
dent, underwent open heart sur­
gery at Baylor Hospital in Dal­
las Wednesday, May 9. He is the 
brother o f Mrs. Leonard Mauldin. 
He withstood the surgery well.

Mrs. J. R. Lee’s sister, Mrs. 
Pearl Gaskey of Oregon vi.sited 
here during the week. Other vis­
itors were Mrs. Lee’s daughter, 
Mrs. Gladys Seward of Ft. 
Worth who visited on Sunday and 
Mrs. Gaskey’s son and daughter 
from Wright City. Okla., visited 
Friday.

Mother’s Day guests in the 
home of Mr, and Mrs. C. W. Pitt­
man were Mr, and Mrs. W. M. 
Austin o f Dallas, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Kirkland of Greenville, r. 
and Mrs. Mack Black and Danny 
and Mrs. Verbeth Wyatte all o f 
Talco.

Mother’s Day guests in the 
home o f Mrs. Dan Seay and Mike 
and Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Rob­
erts, Mona and Jay were Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Ellis of Riverside, 
Calif., Mr. and Mrs. Olen Seay 
and family o f Ft. Worth and Mr. 
and Mrs. Mack McLemorc of 
Commerce.

Gary Russell To 
Attend TNSS 
Austm June 4-7

Gary Rus.sell, a student at 
Praii'iland High School, has been 
selected to attend the 13th Texas 
Nuclear Science Symposium for 
High School at the University of 
Texas in Austin June 4-7. Roy 
White, a science teacher at the 
high school, will accompany him 
to the symposium, both being 
sponsored by Ckimmunity Public 
Service Company, a member of 
the Texas Atomic Energy Re­
search Foundation which is j’oin- 
ing with the University in put­
ting on the symposium.

Some 500 outstanding science 
students and their teachers from 
throughout the state have been 
selected by their schools to at­
tend the four-day meeting where 
scientists and engineers from 
both the industrial and educa­
tional fields will discuss nuclear 
physics, nuclear engineering and 
other related topics.

Two afternoons will be spent 
in touring science laboratories at 
the University, including those 
where experiments in thermonu­
clear research sponsored by the 
T.-\ERF are lieing carried on.

“ We are pleased that we can 
make this opportunity available,” 
Joe Fonville, district manager for 
Community in Depoit said. At­
tending the .symposium will pro­
vide an excellent opportunity for 
learning more about the latest 
achievements in nuclear science ”

Included in the list of speakers 
during the symposium are Dr. W. 
E. Drummond, director of the 
center for plasma physics and 
controlled thermonuclear re- 
seaich at the University o f Tex­
as, and Dr. Harvey L. Cromroy, 
professor o f entomology and 
nematology in the division of 
nuclear science at the University 
of Florida.

Fonville said that Community 
Public Service is vitally inter­
ested in the foundation’s nuclear 
fusion re.search program at the 
University as an important po­
tential source o f  energy for elec­
tric power generation.

JUNIOR HI STUDENTS 
BASKETBALL CAMP

Karen Pirtle and Pam Rogers 
have been accepted to attend 
Ranger Jr. College Basketball 
Camp June 3-8. Both are stu­
dents o f Rivercrest Jr. High 
School. This camp is to teach 
new skills in the fundamentals o f 
sound basketball and to improve 
the skills and individual abilities 
o f each girl. Rivercrest High 
School Coach, Larry Tucker will 
be one o f the coaches.

MONTHLY SINGING AT 
ROCKFORD MAY 19

The second in a series of month­
ly singing conventions is being 
sponsored by the Rockford Home­
coming Association, Saturday 
night. May 18 at 7:30 p. m, in 
the Rockford Church. The pub­
lic is invited. Bring your sing­
ing group and join us for an 
evening o f gospel singing and 
fellowship. The Rockford Church 
is located on Farm to Market 
Road 2497, approximately 16 
miles southeast of Paris.

Special Education 
Funds Approved

Talco - Bogata 
School News

Congressman Wright Patman 
(D-Tex) announced today that 
the U. S. Office of Education has 
approved funds totalling $4,867,- 
344.31 to the First Congressional 
District of Texas to finance spec­
ial programs to benefit educa­
tionally disadvantaged children. 
Funds are provided under the 
Elementary and Secondary Edu­
cation Act o f 1965 for Fiscal 
Year 1973, and will be used to 
help 32,901 handicapped, neglect­
ed, and delinquent children aged 
5 to 17 years.

Grant totals for this area are: 
Lamar, $411,405.74; Red River, 
$233,330.42; Titus, $108,971.46.

By KATHY ASTON and 
AMELIA BOLIN

Mrs. Robinson 
Dies In Ft. Worth

Word has been received of the 
death of .Mrs. Gains Robinson c f 
P’t. Wurth. Mrs. Robinson was 
born in 1913 in Hagan q)ort. dau­
ghter of Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 
Cato. They lived in this vicinity 
several years and in Mt. Pleas­
ant four years.

Slie was the mother of four 
children: Ro.>emary Robinson,
Geraldine Blackburn, Mrs. Rebec­
ca .Martin and Gains Robinson all 
of Ft. Worth; two grandsons, 
Charles Blackburn and Dwight 
Martin, and one granddaughter, 
Karen Martin of Ft. Worth; one 
sister, Mrs. Charlie Nichols of 
Ft. Worth; one uncle, George 
Wiins of Mt. Vernon; four aunts. 
Mr.-i. Ella Bailey o f Houston, 
Mrs. Lorenzo Reed and Mrs. B. 
L. Gieger of Talco and .Mrs. Bob 
Pratt o f Commerce and several 
cousins.

Funeral services were Tuesday 
morning at 10:00 at West Berry 
Church of Christ with L. L. Gie­
ger of Oklahoma City officiat­
ing. Burial was made in Spring- 
town in the Robinson family plot.

Rivercrest Rebelette 
Sets National Mark

Austin. — Linda Montgomery 
of Rivercrest High School threw 
the discus 143 feet, lOVi inches 
to eclipse the national mark of 
138’ 10‘, i ” set in 1969 by Vivian 
Turner of Bellflower, Calif. The 
action took place in the Class A 
finals of the girls state high 
school here.

Mias Montgomery also placed 
third in the shot put with a throw 
o f 44’2” .

Susie Snider of Robinson High 
threw the shot 50’6” for first 
place and also established a na­
tional high school record. The 
old record was 47’9% ” held by 
Mary Jacobsen of Florence, Ore., 
set in 1969.

Conroe High School won the 
Class A team championship. El­
dorado won the Class B team 
championship.

With the end-of-school d«i. 
countdown underway, activities a 
Rivercrest have slowed to a r e g ­
ular routine o f classes.

The 1973-74 Rebel Chrrrlrarlarii 
were selected last Tuesday. Ubiy 
8 following tryouts which wera 
held during a special assenb);. 
The chosen seven are Sherxia 
Taylor. Jr.; Headcheerleadax 
Nita Hanks. Sr., Cynthia Hines 
Jr.. Patti Smith, Sr., Mona 
Wright, Sr., Kim Brook.s, Jr., Lee 
Ann House, Soph.

The annual Freshman Orienta­
tion was held at RHS on Friday, 
May 11, under the direction o f  tha 
Student Council. Orientation ba- 
gan with an assembly in wbiek 
a representative from each Or­
ganization told their require­
ments for membership. This vra* 
followed by a tour of Rivcrcrea* 
with Student Council officers a. 
guides to point important place, 
for the Freshman to remember 
The tour was ended in the cafe­
teria where refreshments were 
served by members o f the FHA.

Linda Montgomery set a new 
national discus record at the 
State meet held in Au.'tin on Sat- 
imlay. May 12. Linda threw the 
discus 140 feet, 11 inches to 
break the national record o f 138-- 
feet, 10'2 inches set in 1969 by 
Vieran Turner of Bellflower, Ca’ 
Congratulations, LIXD.A MONT 
GOMERY!

The Texas Association of 
School Administrators Area VIII- 
A Study Group will meet at 10:00 
a. m. .̂ Iay 17, 1973 at the Kegiora 
VIII Education Service Center 
100 North Kiddle Street, M't. 
Pleasant. Mr. Tainiadge Morgan, 
Area Chairman, announces the 
speaker for this meeting will be 
Dean L. D. Haskew. Department 
of F^ducational Administratim, 
University of Texas at Austin. 
His topic will be “ Successfiol 
Teacher Evaluation.”

The annual Variety Show wUl 
be presented on Friday, May 18. 
at 7:30 p. ni. in the Rivercrant 
High School auditorium. Admis­
sion is $1.00 for adults, 50c for  
students.

A reminder to all parents with 
kindergarten or first grade agr; 
children: PLEASE see your prr-- 
cipal to register these childre 
for the 1973-74 school term.

All Sports Banquet 
Held At Rivercrest

RIVERCREST BAND 
CONCERT SUNDAY 

The Rivercrest Band will pre­
sent a concert, Sunday, May 20, 
at 2 p. m. at the Rivercrest Audi­
torium. The public is invited to 
attend.

Mrs, Jess Waldrum and her 
daughter, Mrs. Delbert Heard 
visited Mrs. Waldruin’s mother. 
Mrs. Renner Tefteller in Sims, 
Sunday afternoon. Mrs. Wal- 
druin reported that her mother 
is doing fine and able to walk 
with the aid of a walker after 
having broken her hip some 
months ago.

Week end guests in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Uniie Hanks and 
Sammy were their daughter, Mrs. 
Donald Newman and family o f 
Ft. Worth, Mr. Hanks' brother 
ami wife. Mr. and Mrs, L. D. 
Hanks of San Pablo, Calif., and 
his sister, Mrs. Eula Mae Jones 
o f Ada, Okla. Mr. and Mrs. L. 
1). Hanks are also visiting other 
relatives in the area.

Rivercrest High School he 
their All-Sports Banquet May 16 
1973, at 7:00 p. m. in the Hisf- 
School Cafeteria. This baRqiwr 
was given in honor o f all 
letes participating in the athletie 
programs at Rivercrest H ig;. 
School. The eighth grade ath­
letes from Talco and Bogata ioth 
honored guests.

The Fighting Rebel Award ftr 
the outstanding football plaF^ 
has been changed to the Gar 
Sam McConnell Memorial AwaB 
in memory of the late Gary M c­
Connell, one of the outstanditx 
athletes, who graduated in 1972 
Awards were also presented t< 
the senior athletes, Outstandhit 
Booster, and others in the var­
ious fields of athletic com pet- 
tion. The guest speoker wa.* 
Coach Bobby Fox, the defensiv 
co-ordinator o f the NAIA Vs 
tional Champion Ea.st Texa' 
State University Football Team.

Mrs. Kill Williams o f  Bcosier 
City. i.ia., and Mrs. Lee H. Love 
les.s of Mt. Pleasant visited Mri 
Wayiran Alexander Thursday 1. 
terroon.

TALCO BUSINESS DIRECTORY
The following TALCO Business Firms invite you to trade with them. They 
appreciate your patonage. Help your community by trading at home.

Mr. and Mrs. Olen Williams 
and Mrs. Edith Stamps were in 
Dallas during the weak end to 
attend the golden wedding anni­
versary o f their friends, Mr. and 
Mrs. Cecil Pritchett and to visit 
Mrs. Stamps’ daughter, Mrs, D. 
S. Tunnell and Mr. Tunnell.

The Fellowship Club met in 
the home o f Mrs. Hershell Kel­
ley last week for its monthly 
luncheon. Opening prayer was 
voiced by Mrs. Lillie Burks. 
Those attending were Mrs. Min­
nie Lee Gibson, Mrs. Dottie Mil­
ler. Mrs. Johnnie Crane, Mrs. Ce­
cil Penn and the hostess. The 
club will not meet during June 
due to several members being on 
vacation.

TOWN SHOPPE
GIFTS —  SPORTSWEAR

Ralph’ii Originals —  Wrangler 
Donavnn-Galvani

Phone 379-4841 Talco, Texas

JONES & BONHAM
DRY GOODS  ̂

Nationally Advertised MerchandlM

Phone 379-3931 Talco, Torn**

B & B Furniture & 
Building Supply

r urniture — Appliances —  TVs —  Stereos 
All Lumber Needs

Phone 379-3441 Talco, Texas

Cecil’s Grocery & Market
FEEDS —  GROCERIES —  Free Deilvoty

Gold Bond Stamps
Phone 379-3641 Talco, Teaa*
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WILKINSON
j  MRS. MORRIS BLALOCK

Monday evening supper guests 
o f  Mr, and Mrs. Morris Blalock 
Mksre Mr and Mrs. C. A. Cass of

Mr. and Mrs. A. T. Blalock 
wfmat Tuesday night in the home 
o f  Mrs. Ada Duran of Pine Hill 

Dunity.
r. and Mrs. Tommie New- 
of Houston visited in the 

Morris Blalock home Wednesday 
-dng.
ITeek end visitors of Mr. and 
L A . T. Blalock were Mr. and 

Jerry Riddle and children 
ga Jrving.

Tnesday visitors o f Mrs. Vir- 
j jM. Farr were Mrs. Frankie Nell 
SkCflor and granddaughter, An- 

of Gladewatcr and Friday 
oiMtar was Mrs. A. W. Sparks 
jC  Longview. Saturday visitors 
soare Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Rector

Jiskcogdoches, Mrs. Frances 
Makortson and children. John, 

and Lori Stephenson of Mt. 
ant and Mrs. Georgia Ran- 

Mtm o f  Mt. Pleasant.
fitinday visitors of Mrs. Ger- 

SEode Temples were Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Bob Temples of Long­
view.

Kev. Garnett Walker of Mt. 
Fleasant was a Sunday dinner 
goest of Mr. and Mrs. C. G. 
Flkillips.

Week end visitors o f Mrs. Vir- 
gie Graf were Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Howard and children of Athens, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Smith and 
children of Oklahoma City and 
S /Sgt. Charles Graf of Big 
Spring.

Mrs. Ruby Harris attended a 
closing o f school program at the 
Jack and Jill Kindergarten Sat- 
nrday evening in Mt. Pleasant. 
Her little great-granddaughter, 
Denise Brownlee, was in the pro­
gram.

Mrs. Ruby Harris spent Satur­
day night and Sunday with her 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Dean 
urownlee of Mt. Pleasant.

Tue.sday visitors of Mrs. P,uby 
.^iarris were Mr. and Mrs. Dean 
Hrownlee of Mt. Pleasant and 
Sunday evening visitors were 
Mrs. Opal Huddleston and Mrs. 
Jimmie Bob Shipp o f Mt. Pleas­
ant.

Saturday evening visitors of 
Mrs. Ruby Harris were Rev. and 
Mrs. Gaylon Riddle and children 
o f  Ft. Worth.

Saturday night and Sunday vis­
itors o f Mr. and Mrs. Morris Bla­
lock were .Mr. and Mrs. James 
DeLaughter and daughter, Tracy

LITTLE-KfiOW N FACTS AB OUT W ATER

Easy tc i'tftBU., the new AMF water fiUet is the answer to 
many 'TaUr <,;ttillty ptobleuia. At tight, the woman baa found 
the l est ioiutk-n. .......
‘ In Sahara, t  rich mar of its unpleasant taste."
chant or.c4paidff camel diiyac 
$20,000 for hla goxrd of 
water. But dslJvered to your 
tap, 60 gcUotis of vhis deli­
cious, fresh, liquid asset coita 
you less tfaaa a bottle of pop 
today.

Though most water sup­
pliers throughout the nation 
have the purest of motives, 
modern living conditions are 
creating various water prob­
lems. Already over-burdened 
water works must cope with 
them. One is the difficulty 
in removing matter that dis­
solves in water, such as fallen 
leaves, chloride run-off from 
salted roadways, as well as 
debris from road washings 
and storm drains, and petro­
leum pollutants from traffic.

“ Other impurities some­
times found in water supplies," 
according to Dr. L.S.GoIdring, 
Manager o f the Chemical and 
Physical Research Division o f 
AMF, Inc., “ are hydrogen sul­
fide, which gives water that rot­
ten egg smeii, and iron which 
has a pecuiiar taste weii-re- 
membered by those who have 
tried it. Both are usuaiiy re­
moved by pubiic water works, 
but both can be a probiem in 
private water suppiies. Chio- 
rinc, which is frequently add­
ed by pubiic water suppiiers, 
is a common problem because

There are also visible im­
purities, he observes. Both 
rust and sediment can come 
from old pipes in older neigh­
borhoods or buildings. Dr. 
Gcldring adds that “the visible 
imourities-tbe particles, the 
sediment and the rust, and 
the algae~can be removed by 
the cellulose fiber section of 
a new filter." Substances that 
Ivave off-tastea and aromas, 
like chlorine, are removed by 
^tration through an activated 
c ^ c o tl  section.

A  significant development 
in making home drinking wa­
ter taste better and in ensur­
ing that foods taste fresh and 
delicious is the AMF Cuno 
Aqua-Pure Home Water Filter. 
It not only filters out dirt 
and rust but removes bad 
tastes and odors such as chlo­
rine and other harsh elements. 
A  homeowner can easily in­
stall it with a do-it-yourself 
kit. Or it can be attached by a 
plumber. The versatile Aqua- 
Pure Home Water Filter can 
also be installed under sinks 
in vacation homes as well as 
in mobile homes or boats to 
ensure quality water. . .wher­
ever you travel.

Available through plumbingj 
suppliers, the filter puts spring- 
quality water on tap at a frac­
tion o f a cent per gallon.

o f Irving, Mr. and Mrs. Randy 
Allen and daughter, Denia Mac 
o f Dallas and .Mr. and Mrs. Elton 
Crabtree of Mesquite.

Week end visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. C. A. Dyke were Mr. and 
Mrs. James Buchanan and dau­
ghter of Dalla.s, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glyn Goates and children o f Mt.

Pleasant.
Week end visitors of Bro. and 

Mrs. .\lvin Blalock were Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Blalock and girls of Mt. 
Plea.-^ant.

Sonnie Bragg, son o f Mrs. 
Winnie Bragg of California spent 
last week with her and visited 
his sister. Mrs. Hugh Crooks of

STARTS TODAY

Frigidaire
Week
It’s back! The once-a-year sale that smart appliance buyers have been 
waiting for . . . Frigidaire Week. Right now, prices have been slashed on 
dependable, top-quality Frigidaire appliances. So come on smart, appli­
ance buyers save big —  this is your week for Frigidaire.

AUTOMATIC GAS & ELECTRIC COMPANY
37 Clarksville St. PARIS 783-1686

Midway and Mrs. Morris Deaton 
o f Winfield and other relatives 
and friends.

Nokey Blalock is doing better 
in the Hospital i n Shreveport. 
Clif Franks and Mrs. W'eldon 
Dyke visited her father. Mr. Bla­
lock in the hospital in Shreveport 
Sunday.

Bridal Courtesy 
For Miss Grayson

Miss Glenna Grayson, bride- 
elect of Mr. Clifton Duncan was 
the honoree at a shower Friday 
from eight until nine o ’clock in 
the home of Mrs, E. L. Miller.

Miss Grayson is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Grayson 
of Sulphur Springs. The bride­
groom-elect is the son o f Mr. and 
Mrs. E. W. Duncan Jr. o f Talco.

Guests were greeted by Mrs. 
E. L. Miller and alternating hos­
tesses. The bride’s register was 
displayed on a small polished ta­
ble flanked by a small antique 
gold vase holding tiny flowers of 
the bride’s chosen colors.

Refreshments were served from 
the dining table which was cover­
ed with a white imported Irish 
linen cloth. Centering the table 
was a beautiful arrangement of 
straw flowers in wrought iron 
containers flanked by wrought 
iron caiidleholdei's with yellow 
tapers. Punch and dainty sand­
wiches were served by Miss An­
nette Swaiin and Mrs. Susan 
Dodd. Table appointments were 
in crystal and silver.

Mrs. Grayson and Mrs. Duncan 
were piesented white cor.'ages for 
the occasion.

The guests were directed to 
the bedroom by the hostesses 
w here they admired the many 
useful and beautiful gifts.

Hostes.--es for the occasion 
were .Vlmes. .V. E. Foster, Larry 
Tucker, Saminie Murtoii, Ois 
Swaim, C. 1. Case, Lyndon Reed. 
Nadine Caldwell, J. C. McGona- 
gill, O. D. Welch and E. L. Miller.

Out of town guests were Mrs. 
Burgara Lewis of Dallas, Mrs. 
Tri.>;ie Smith of Sulphur Bluff 
and Mr.'. E. R. Grayson of Sul- 
pliur Springs.

Recent Bride Is 
Shower Honoree

Mrs. Bobby Kuhl. the former 
Miss Patty Horn, was honored 
Monday evening with a miscel­
laneous shower at the home of 
Mrs. Wayman Alexander. Co­
hostesses were Mrs. Dick Hood, 
Mrs. Vivian Westbrook, Mrs. 
Jack Mills and Mrs. Cliff Jones.

Kitchen corsages were given to 
the honoree, her mother, Mrs. 
Lyndon Horn and the groom’s 
mother, Mrs. Dorothy Stephens.

The refreshment table was laid 
with a white cloth with an over­
lay of white net. A massive ar­
rangement of pink lilacs and 
sweet peas in a gold compote. 
The hoste.sses alternated in serv­
ing pink fruit punch, white cuke 
squares, mints and nuts. T he 
many lovely gifts were displayed 
in the bedroom.

Miss Vickie Horn, sister of the 
bride, presided at the register 
wheie approximately 25 guests 
signed the bride’s book.

CARD OF THANKS
We want to thank our friends 

and neighbors for every act of 
kindness, the food, cards, visits 
and flowers. Your expression of 
sympathy will always be remem­
bered.

The Family of Mrs. Lallie 
Welch

Saturday visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Marshall Sikes 
were Mr. and Mrs. Rex Sikes and 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. Lee Hal- 
field all of Garland and Mr. and 
Mrs. Bobby Sikes and chnildren 
of Mt. Pleasant.

Pays to Advertise.

SMITH CARPETS

ADVEHTISEMFAT FOR BIDS 
SEWAGE TREATMENT PLANT
The City of Talco 
Titus County. Texas 
WPC-Tex-706

Separate sealed bids for the 
constiuction of a 125,0000 gallon 
contact stabilization process sew­
age treatment plant for the City 
of Talco, Texas will be received 
by the City Council at the office 
oif the City Secretary, City Hall, 
Talco, Texas 7.5487, until 7:00 P. 
M. C. S. T. May 31, 1073, and 
then at said office publicly open­
ed and read aloud.

The information for bidders, 
form of contract, plans, specifi­
cations, and other contract docu­
ments may be examined at the 
following: City Secretary’s Of­
fice. City Hall, Talco, Texas 
7.'i487 and Haytcr Engineering, 
254 Hickory Street, Paris, Texas 
75460.

Copies may be obtained at the 
office o f Hayter Engineering lo­
cated at 254 Hickory Street, Par­
is, Texas upon the deposit of 
$35.00 for eacE set. Any deposit 
will be refunded upon the return 
of the plans and specifications 
promptly and in good condition.

The Owner reserves the right 
to waive any informalities or to 
reject any or all bids.

Each bidder must deposit with 
his bid security in the amount, 
form, and subject to the condi­
tions provided in the information 
for bidders.

Attention of bidders is parti­
cularly called to the require­
ments as to conditions of em­
ployment to be observed and 
minimum wage rates to be paid 
under the contract.

-\’o bidder may withdraw his 
bid within (10 days after the act­
ual date of the opening thereof.

Bidders on this work will be 
required to comply with the 
President’s Executive Order No. 
112K). The requirements for bi<l- 
ders and contractors under this 
order are explained in the speci­
fications.

The City of Talco, Texas tl6c

Mr. and Mrs. Billy McElroy of 
Austin visited his brother. Her­
man McElroy and Mrs. McElroy 
here during the wetk end.

Mother’s Day guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Wayman 
Alexander were their daughters. 
Miss Berenda Alexander of For­
ney and -Mr. and Mrs. Bill Capel 
of Houston, Mrs. .Alexander’s sis­
ter-in-law, Mrs. Durward Garret- 
son, her son, Gary Hay and dau­
ghter, Mrs. Debbie Lee and her 
' .̂augh(<’ r. Cbristi Jade all ofGads 
den. Ala., Mrs. Jay Garretson and 
Mrs. Myrtle Keener, both of 
Talco.

May Madness Sale
Remember! — All Prices Shown Include Pad and Installation In Your Home!

Cushioned VINYL LINOLEUM
6’ & 12’ Widths —  Compare At $5.95

$2^5 sq. yd.
Normal Installation

Indoor - Outdoor CARPET
Great for Dens, Kitchens, Patios —  Regular $7.95

$g50  sq. yd.
Includes Pad and Complete Installation

100% Nylon Sculptured PILE
Regular $7.95

$^50 sq. yd.
Installed With Pad 

BAN K  RATE HNANCING IN OUR STORE ARRANGED

100% Nylon Heavy, Heavy SHAG
Compare at $9.50

$050 sq. yd.
Installed With Pad

CALX, 785-6491 FOR FREE ESTIMATES

SMITH CARPETS

WANT ADS The Talco Times
Rates: 6 cents per word first in­
sertion; 3 cents per word each ad- 
Jitional insertion. No ad a<xept- 
ea for less than 75 cents per issue. 
Terms cash unless you are a legu- 
,ar advertiser in this newspaper.

NEW HAY for sale on the mea­
dow. J. J. Alsobrook, 632- 
5639. dl6tl5b33-p

Published Every Thursday 
GEORGE W. GRANT. JERRY D, 
BURNS, Owners i.td Publi.«her»

WE GIVE full cash allowance on 
.ANY and ALL burial or insur­
ance policies. Ledeen - Perkins, 
Mt. Pleasant Funeral Home, t-tfc

WE BUY PINE TIMBER —  de­
livered or on the stump. Phone 
write or come by. General Man­
ager, Leggett & Platt Inc., P. O. 
Box 430. Naples, Texas 75668. 
Phone 214-897-5431 days or 214- 
897-5173 nights. tb-tfc

GARAGE SALE —  at home o f 
Mrs. Jerry Jones Saturday 9:00 
to 11:00 a. m. 1 stereo, 2 tele­
vision sets, 1 hair dryer, refrig­
erator, children’s clothes, other 
articles. tl5-c

GEORGE W. G R A N T .....  Editoi
JERRY D. BURNS Adv. Mgr. 

MRS. WAYMAN ALEXANDER,
MRS. SALLY BAKER .......Adv.
Ph. 379-4445. News - Advertising

Entered as Second Class Mattes 
March 20, 1936, at the Postoffice 
at Talco. Texas.

SINGER SEWING Machine Co., 
Sales, rentals and expert service. 
All kind.s machines, fabrics and 
notions at Brookshire Shopping 
Center, Paris. phone 784- 
7423. dbt-tfc
MOBILE HOME for sale— 14x73. 
sturdy built 1971 model, 2 bed­
rooms, large living area, kitchen 
with garbage disposal, dish wash­
er. 2 full baths with showers, 
fully carpeted except kitchen and 
bath. Concrete steps for all 3 
doors. Carport, patio covers, 
storage room. Contact Aubrey 
Harris, Insurance man, Paris, 
781-8012 at night. dbt-tfc

Mother’s Day guests with Mr. 
and Mrs. W. T. Lewis were their 
daughters. Mrs. Mike Blackburn, 
.Mr. Blackburn and children of 
Sylvan. .Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Lillie and children o f Gainesville, 
also Mr. and Mrs. Bill Vickers and 
Ter.a of Talco.

SUBSCRIPTION PRICE 
In Titus, Franklin and Red Rivei 

Counties 
$2.50 a Year

When Sent ElsewTiere In th« 
States the Subscription Price ii 

$3.50 a Year

Skeet Horn and daughter, Jean- 
ie Beth o f Lufkin spent Mother’s 
Day with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Arvin Horn.

Mother’s Day visitors in the 
home o f Mr. and Mrs. D. A. Nee- 
ley were their children and grand, 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Wat­
kins of Whiteoak, Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald Watkins and son, Don of 
Commerce, Mrs. Jlickey Brewer 
and Cathy of Gladewater, .Andy 
Grower and his girlfriend, Robin 
o f Bossier City, La., Janies Wea­
ver and Pam and Ray Dillard of 
Monticello. After noon visitors 
were Mr. and Mrs. John Northani, 
Mrs. R. T. Fuller and Bro. John­
ny Umphries.

107 Grand

NOTICE
PARIS BEAUTY SCHOOL

“VVe Build Successful Careers’’ 

Veterans Approved
AN NU AL REDUCTION OF TUITION  

$50 Dollars Off For Limited Time

Classes Starting Each Week 
TERMS ON TUITION  

PARIS, TEXAS 784-6850

PHONE 785-6491
1545 Clarksville —  PARIS

PHONE 785-6491 
WILLIAMSBURG SHOPPING CENTER

2 0 %  O F F
On All Gasgrills!!!
(& accM sories, too, whenX 

bought with a Gasgrill. /

SPRING AND SUMMER COOKING moves outdoors, 
leaves the kitchen coot, with a new Gasgrill by Arklal 
Cook a single burger or a backyard banquet 
on these top-quality grills, built of heavy cast 
aluminum lor long life.
20% OFF NOW, until Juno 2 . . .  on a Gasgrill, 
or any of a variety of accessories, like rotisseries, 
portable carts, etc. NO DOWN PAYMENT, 
low payments on your Arkla Gas bill.

FLAVOR TWIN
s h o w n  St rig h t  Is s  v s r s s tlle  t w in -c o n tro l 
g rill th a t a ffo r d s  a lm o s t lim itla s s  
h a s t  l a v a l a . . .  B r o a d  c o o k in g  a r a a  
a n d  p o ta to  r a c k .
(S h a ir  a n d  p a tio  s ta n d , a c c e s s o r ia t  In  p h o to , m a y  
b e  b o u g h t fo r 2 0 %  o ff w h e n  b o u g h t w ith  a  
Q a s g r ill.)
R e g u la r  p ric e  $ 1 4 5 ., in s ta lle d . S a le  p r i c e : S 1 1 0 .g  
In s ta lle d .
T o ta l  fin a n c e d  p r i c e : $ 1 3 1 .8 0 . (2 4  m o t .
3 %  s a le s  t a x ) .
A n n u a l p a rc e n t ra te : 9 .7 5 % '
(M o n t h ly  p a y m e n t s  v a r y  w ith  lo c a l ta x e s .)

ONLY

$5.47
PER MO. ON YOUR 
GAS BILL

F L A V O R  F O U R S O M E
O n l y

$8.52
o s r  m o . o n  y o u r  goo b M L  
R e g u la r  p r i c e : $ 2 2 5 ., in s ts llo d . 
S s i t  p r k a :  t t S O . ,  In s ts llo d . 
N E W I  F o u r  c o n tr o ls , t w o  g rills , 
h s n d i o m s  b s s o . F i v e  sq. f t  
c o o k in g  s p s c s l W o o d r iir s in o d  
v in y l c j v o r s d  fr o n t  t r e y .
Q r s s t  lo r  " r s d is n t  h o a t”  
c o o k i n g .

F L A V O R  K IT C H E N  T w o  g rills  o n  asms boss; In d iv id u a l
c o n tro ls .
O n l y  $ 6 . 9 9 p o r m o o n y . u r g . s b « t .
R e g u la r  p r i e s : t I S S . ,  In s ta lle d . S o la  p r i c a : t I M . ,  In s ta lta d .

FLAVOR KINO 
O n l y

$4.00
p a r  m a  o n  y o u r  g a s  M i l  
R e g u l a r  p r i c e : $ 1 0 5 .. In s ta lle d . 
S a l e  p r i c e : $ M . ,  In s ta lle d . 
S in g le  b u rn e r 
Q a s g r IM . S m a l l e r , b u t  
v a r y  r e lia b le .
O f f e r s  3 6 2  sq. In . 
o f  c o o k i n g  a r e a .

FLAVOR Q IAN T S ln g le -b u m e r  v e r s io n  o f  th e  F l a v o r .  
T w i n  w ith  u n iq u e  fe a t u r e : It s w iv e ls  s w a y  f r o m  w in d .
O n l y  $ 4 . 7 4  p e r  m e . o n  y o u r  g a s  b M .
R e g u la r  p r i c e : $ 1 2 5 . , In s ta lle d . S a le  p r i c e : $ 1 0 0 ., In e ta tle d .

ADD HANDSOME ACCESSORIES such at a portaMa patio cart, amoka otran on lha 
Flavor Kltehan and Flavor Fourtom a. . .  a daluxa front ahall with cutting board, 

rollsaarla, patio atand. . .  AH for 20% off whan you buy a Oaogrlll.

A r k l a



THE TALCO TIMES, TALCO, TEXAS, THURSDAY, M AY 17, 1973

1

I I

Subscribe To

r > i

f tTalco Time 
$2.50 per Y ear

IN TITUS AND ADJOINING COUNTIES —  8A0 ELSEWHERE

THE TALCO TIMES,
TALCO, T E X A a

Enclosed find check or money order for $_ 

Send The Talco Times one year to

Name

Street or P. O. Box

City- Zone____ State.

USE THIS ORDER BLANK



k *

i'

I

THE TALCO TIMES, TALCO, TEXAS, THURSDAY, M AY 17, 1973

< f
'ir

r.l

I

lOCRNEWS
JRS. WAYMAN ALEXANDER

Phone 379-4445

i Mrs. Durwaid Garrutbon. her 
Son, Gary Kay and daughter. Mrs. 
iJibbie Lee and her dau((hter. lit­
tle Christ! Jade from iGad.sden, 
Ala., spent front Saturday until 
Tuesday with Mrs. Jay (larretson 
and Mrs. Myrtle Keeiicj-.

Mr. and Mrs. John G. Lewis, 
Shana and Serena o f Gainesville 
visited Mr. and .Mrs. E. O. Frye 
Sunday. Together with Mr. and 
.Mrs. Loyd Lewis and Jana from 
Texarkana they visited their par- 
ents. .Mr. and .Mrs. J. K. Lewis in 
the Gares Nursing Home.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Jones, 
Eric and Lisa of Little Kock, 
Ark., spent the week end here 
with their aunt, Mrs. Dick Hood 
and family and with their uncle 
Cliff Jones, also with Mr. and 
Mr.s. Johnny Hood .

.Mother’s Day guests in the 
home of .Mr. and .Mrs. A. E. Fos­
ter were their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. James A. Foster and family 
of Garland. Mr. and Mrs. iirack 
McDonald and boys o f Arlington 
and .Mrs. Larry Kent and children 
i f Dec itur.

.OHNTOWN
By MRS. F.. V PIRTLE

The following ladie.s from the 
Raptist Church here attended the 
Di.strict Ladies Auxiliary p i t t ­
ing at the Avery MissionaiV 
Baptist Church, Tuesday, along 
with their pastor. Rev. Calvin 
Hancock: Mrs. Tom I’ irtle, Mrs. 
Kd Childers, .Mrs. Harvey Jer.'i, 
Mrs. Eunice I’ irtlc, Mrs. Mildred 
Mayfield, Mrs. Jewel Pope, Mrs.

W. B. McCalister, and Rev. Billy 
Daniels, who was conducting a 
revival last week.

Mr. and Mrs. J. T.Sells and Mr. 
Sells’ mother, .Mrs. Maud Sells, 
visited in VVynnewood, Okla.. 
Sunday with .Mrs. Maud Sells’ 
cousins. Hay Martin and .Miss 
Maggie and Miss Laura Martin. 
It was the first time in seventy- 
five years .Mrs. Sells had seen 
Laura.

J. O. (Boots) Cooper visited in 
Corpus Christ! from Tuesday to 
Sunday with his sister,' .Mrs. 
Amos Wright who is in a hospital 
there with pneumonia, and Mr. 
Wright, another sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Frances and a bro­
ther, Mr. and Mrs. Loy Cooper.

The public is invited to attend 
the Red River County Singing 
Convention here at the Baptist 
Church Saturday night. May lU 
and Sunday. .May SiO. There will 
be lunch served Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Williams 
and Rev. George Crawford of 
Longview attended the revival 
here Tuesday night and visited in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Drue 
Pirtle at their home here.

Sunday afternoon guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Jean were 
his brothers, Mr. and Mrs. .Mar­
lon Maroney, Mr. and Mrs. Rob­
ert Maroney, Mr. and Mrs. Ray­
mond Jean and niece, Mrs. Pam 
King and children, Jacob and 
Salya o f Boxelder. Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Height o f McNeil, Ark., 
Mrs, Joe Mauldin of Grand Prai­
rie; his mother, .Mrs. John Par­
ker of Bogata nursing home and 
Mrs. Mildred Bain.
, Mrs. Dave Baxter accompanierl 

her son. Charlie V. .Morris to his 
home in Caddo, Okla.. Thur.'day 
for a visit, but had to return 
home Friday because of illness.

• Mr. and .Mrs. Dean Cates and 
son, Ray, have purchased a new 
house and had it moved in on a 
lot just east of their home.

Mr. and Mrs. Burl Moore were 
in Brownfield Thur.-iday and Fri­
day to attend the funeral of their

nephew, Friday.
Mrs. Sammy Hervey was in 

Paris Thursday for medical at­
tention. She was accompanied 
by Mrs. Wendell Hervey.

Mr. and .Mrs. Bill Thomas and 
children, Bettie, Eddie and Jerry 
of Texarkana, spent the week 
end with her mother, Mrs. W. N. 
Dodd and Mr. Dodd.

Mr. and Mrs. R. T. White and 
family of Chico were week end 
guests of his mother, Mrs. Mil- 
ured .Mayfield.

Dinner guests o f Mr. and Mrs. 
E. V. Pirtle Sunday were their 
children and grandchildren. Mr. 
and Mrs. Drue Pirtle of Long­
view, Vance Portle of .Mt. Pleas­
ant, Mr. and .Mrs. Harvey Jean 
and children, Donald, Dana. Dale 
and Darla nd Miss Tonya House.

Mrs. Katie Pirtle has retured 
to her home after a v isit in Am­
arillo with her son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Twyman Pirtle and daughters.

Mrs. Effie Oliver is visiting 
her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. No­
ble Ray Jackson.

Mr. and Mrs. Coy Vicars and 
John M. Click of Sulphur Springs 
visited Mr. and Mrs. H. E. Haw­
kins Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. George Thomas, Mrs. 
Mary Earl Emith of Texarkana 
and Mrs. Herbert Betts of De- 
Kalb and Mrs. Bill Ward of Bo­
gata visited Mr. and Mrs. H. K. 
Hawkins. Tuesday.

Mrs. Charles Williams, former­
ly Miss Sharia Beth Morri.s, was 
honored with a bridal shower 
Saturday afternoon in the home 
of Mrs. Hubert Horn. Hostesses 
were .Mines. Rhonda Horn, Dar­
lene Bell, Nell Rhodes, Diann 
Booker and Mrs, Horn. Special 
guests were Mrs. Dick Morris, 
grandmother o f the bride and 
Mrs. Roy Moriis and Mrs. H. E. 
Hawkins, her aunts. Mrs. Bell 
had charge of the register where 
■12 registered. Mr. and Mrs. Wil­
liams make their home in Shreve­
port, where both are employed 
for Pro. Inc.

Mrs. B, F. Rhodes Jr.. LVN, is 
home on vacation this week from

INSTANT RELIEF FROM HIGH PRICES
ARE FOUND AT

McKELLAR’S PHARMACY
Shop All 3 McKellar Pharmacies

MT. PLEASANT —  DAINGERFIELD —  NAPLES  

Double S&H Green Stamps On Wednesday With $2.50 Purchase Or More

Aller Creme, Mild Astrin­
gent, 8 Ozs. 88<^

Aller Creme, Skin
Lotion, 8 Ozs. $]^33

Prell Concentrate
Shampoo, 7 ozs. 9 7 '

Ursinus, Deep Congestant 
Analgesic tablets 24 for J29

Triaminicin, 12 tablets 5 5 '

Theragran Hi Potency
Vitamins, 30 tablets 5 5 '

k>W|

You Wouldn't Attend A 

Wedding Without An Invitation

The Same Thing Applies 
When You Go 

Shopping

The j^tores That Want 
Your Business Will i

Invite You to
Come In

Each week progressive merchants use the pages of this 
paper to extend you an invitation to come in and look 
over their wares. These merchants SEEK your busi­
ness. In return all they ask is that you come in and 
see what they have to offer. It is a pretty safe bet 
that the merchant who goes to the trouble to IKVTTE 
3TOU In will treat you right when you accept his in­
vitation.

PATRONIZE OUR ADVLiiTISERS 

WHO INVITE YOU TO DO SO

SKY-HIGH PliMK LEMONADE PIE

How many timet have you enjoyed those great looking, 
great tasting, fluffy high pies that are the specialty of many 
great restaurants? And how many times did you wonder if 
they were difficult or expensive to make? Well, if you’ve only 
eaten these delightful pies when dining out, now you can make 
a perfect beauty at home with this simple recipe.

Unflavored gelatine is the indispensable ingredient for this 
special kind of 'pie, holding the creamy light filling high and 
firm as it chills. It’s an economical dessert despite its look of 
luxury. Lemonade concentrate is inexpensive, and instead of 
whipped cream, evaporated milk is used, which helps to cut 
calories, too.

PINK LEMONADE PIE
1 envelope unflavored gelatine 

cup cold water
1 can (6 ounces) frozen lemonade 

concentrate, thawed, undiluted 
cup sugar

1 cup evaporated milk, chilled 
Red food coloring

1 frozen 9-inch pie crust shell, baked
Sprinkle gelatine over cold water and undiluted lemonade 
concentrate in saucepan. Place over low heat; stir constantly 
until gelatine dissolves, about 5 minutes. Remove from heat; 
add sugar and stir until dissolved. Chill, stirring occasionally, 
until completely cooled. Pour chilled evaporated milk into 
chilled mixing bowl; beat at high speed of electric mixer until 
stiff, about 5 minutes. Fold in cooled gelatine mixture. Add a 
few drops of red food coloring to make pink color. Turn into 
cooled pie crust shell. Chill until Hrm, about 2 hours. For a 
frosty-cold pie, place ip freezer for 4 hours. If frozen overnight 
or longer, remove from freezer 15 to 20 minutes before serv­
ing. YIELD: 6 servings.

Misses Pam and Kim Allen at­
tended Youth Service at the First 
Baptist Church in Paris Wednes­
day evening.

Mr. and .Mrs. Dennis Bazhaw 
and family spent the week end 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Pearson and Mrs. Iva Cohee of 
Dallas and Mr. and Mrs. .Mike 
Hawks of Plano.

Visiting with .Mr. and Mrs. Zeb 
Page during the week were Mr. 
and Mrs. I'orter Page of Bogata, 
Dell Watson of Paris, Ernest 
Hamm of Deport, Taylor Ladd, 
Mrs. Della Howe and Mrs. Hilda 
Clement.

Rev. and .Mrs. Lewis Ricketson 
of Emerson visited with Mr. and 
.Mrs. F’ red Allen. Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Zeb Page visited 
-Mr. and .Mrs. Leonard Ellis of 
Hail and Mr. and .Mrs. Birdie 
Claypool of Ben P'ranklin. Tues­
day.

Mrs. Berniece Wyatt spent 
Sunday with her aunt, Mrs. Fred 
King and Mr. King o f Paris.

Mrs. Cuie Kennedy, .Mrs. Rillis 
Merrifield and .Mr. and Mrs. Jer­
ry Merrifield of Dallas with Mr. 
and Mrs. Zeb Page attended a 
other’s Day dinner at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Marshall Ken­
nedy of Clardy. Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Perry D. Ashford 
o f Dallas visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Buddy Taylor and Mrs. Allie 
Rees, Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Cox and 
Shelly of Dallas spent the week 
end with .Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Cox. 
Shelly remained for a week’ s 
visit.

.Mr. and Mrs. Ted Richardson 
of Riardstown spent Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve Ladd.

Mr. and Mrs. Aimer Norwood 
had as Mother’s Day guests Mr. 
and Mrs. Darold Norwood of 
Paris, .Mr. and Mrs. Cnord Nor­
wood, Rickey and Teresa of De­
port. Mr. and Mrs. Danny Nor­
wood and family o f Taylortown, 
-Mr. and Mr.s. Eugene Nrwood,

Frankie and Scottty, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Norwood and family, Mr. 
and -Mrs. Talma Norwood and 
Jay and Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
White and Jonathan, and .Mr. and 
Mr.s. Billy R. Oats and Brandon.

Mr. and .Mrs. Steve Ladd and 
family visited with Mr. and .Mr.s. 
Gary Huddleston of Rugby Sat­
urday evening.

.Mr. and Mr.s. David Taylor and 
Amy of Ft. Worth visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Cox and Mr. 
and Mrs. Buddy Taylor, Sunday 
afternoon.

.Mr. and Mr.s. Fred Allen visit­
ed Ross Warren ini the McCuis- 
tion Hospital. Friday.

.Mr. and Mrs. Harry Slusher 
were dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Dale Smyers o f Paris, Sun­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. William Cooper 
and Deryl visited Mrs. John 
Franks in the Bogata nursing 
home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Betterton of 
Paris visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
William Cooper Sunday after­
noon.

Fulhright Club 
Meets Thursday

The Fulbrihgt Good Neighbor 
Club met Thursday with Mrs. 
Georgia Rozell and Miss Selma 
Baker hostesses. Maude Legate, 
the president. presided and 
brought the program on Mother’s 
Day. Assisting her were Kath­
erine Campbell. Gladys Wright. 
Stella Ridens, Essie Mae Kerhow. 
Roll call was answered with 
Something About Mother. Lillie 
.Stevens was eletced Senior Citi­
zen. She will be honoerd Sunday 
afternoon at the Community 
Center at 2 o ’clock.

The hostess .-erved cold drinks 
and sandwiches to 14 members 
and one guest. Ruby Baker. Next 
meeting will be May 24 with 
Katherine Campbell hostess.

Red River Haven. They also vis­
ited her (laMtrhter, Mi-. Crry 
Howard of Talco, Sunday, who 
has an injured aiilde after a horse 
fell on her foot.

Stephen Morris of Pasgoula, 
Mi.ss., called his mother, Mr.s. 
Jess Morris, Saturday to wish her 
a happy Mother.s Day.

JUNNINGRAM
-y MRS. BERNIECE WYATI
District Supt. C. C. Sessions of 

Paris occupied the pulpit at the 
Methodist Church Sunday in the 
absence of the pa.stor. Rev. Gary 
Lindlcy.

Mi.sses Pam and Kim Allen 
went to Six Flags Saturday with 
the FHA.

Mrs. Dorothy Dean Baker o f 
Longview, Buddy Pynes o f Dal­
las and Donna S.. Dennis. Darwin 
and Lisa Pynes of Paris and Mr. 
and Mrs. Dennis Bazhaw and 
family spent Mother’s Day with 
Mrs. Clifford Pynes and Mr.

Pynes.
•Mrs. Harry Slusher visited 

.'Irs. Lessie Malone in the home 
of her daughter. Mrs. C. B. Chan­
dler of Clai'k.-iville, Friday.

Mrs. destine Rupard o f Gar­
land spent the week end with Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence O’Neal.

.Mr. and Mrs. Larry Bell, David 
oni Mike. .Mr. and Mrs. Teddy 
Jones and family and Mrs. Etta 
Bartlett of Paris, Mr. and Mrs. 
Norman Sain and Mrs. Mae Pos­
ey of Talco spent Sunday with 
Ivir. and Mrs. Ural Deshong.

Mrs. Georgia L. Hatfield and 
Sherry o f Dallas spent the week 
end with her mother, Mrs. Ethel 
Marshall.

Mr. and Mrs. James D. Nor­
wood and family were dinner 
guests o f Mr. and Mrs. James 
Winters of Reno.

Bill Carson and daughter of 
Texarkana were dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. .Arthur Capps, Sta- 
urday.

Mr. and Mrs. Dean Watson and 
family spent the week end at the 
Lake O’ Pines.

BOGATA AIR CONDITIONING
AUTHORIZED DEALER FOR

Weather-King by Dearborn
Central Air Conditioning & Heating 

Commercial & Residential
DEARBORN WINDOW UNITS

Air Conditioning And 
Refrigeration Service

IT’S TIME TO GET THOSE AIR CONDITIONERS 
CHECKED FOR SUMMER USE

Phone 632-5230 — after six 632-5019

An electric freezer is one 
o f the most helpful ap­
pliances you own. And by 
using it wisely you can 
save money and electricity 
while you serve delicious 
meals to your family.
"I hese tips on the proper 
wise and care can help you.

I f  possible, keep your 
freezer in the co o lest' 
spot in the room  . . .  
away from  the range.

I f  your freezer is not 
frost free, defrost it be­

fore ice builds up to 14 
inch thickness. Ice causes 
the com pressor to 
work longer aixl harder.

Take advantage o f  
sales and foods that 
are in season.

D on ’t overload your 
freezer, as it may re­
quire m ore electricity 
to keep food cool.
T hii is nnr o f .1 sriirs o f monrv sjving siigj{rstii>ns frnai 
C:oinnuinily Piihik Sri vkr Unin|>anv In help \<iu gri thr mint 
eifKicnl and ecnnnnikal iisr Irom rirrirkitv.

CDMMONITY POBIIC SE B V IK
Vour BhcHic Ugh! & Rwfr Company

A n  E q u a l O p p o rtu n ity  C m p lo y t r

►>.1, '

DAVID HUDSON. Manager


