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Lubbock Invites Roach
Lavern Roach of Piainview, one 

of the leading contenders for the 
world’s middleweight boxing crown 
has been approached by a group of 
ct^ic-minded Lubbcc^ sportsmen, 
who have offered the former Mar­
ine fighting ace a guarantee of 
$7,500 to stage an exhibition in the 
Hub City in June.

The group of sportsmen, desir­
ing to remain anonymous, has 
signed Bert Kahn as promoter of 
the fight, which might be held in 
either Texas Tech’s new stadium, 
or at Rosenthal Field.

Roach’s opponent would be Wild 
Bill McDowell, one of the most 
ringwise veterans in the boxing 
profession McDowell, at present 
in Phoenix, Ariz., already has ac­
cepted a smaller guarantee to fight 
the Piainview boxer.

A niajority of the profits from 
the fight would be given either to 
the Lubbock Boys club or to the 
Matador club at Tech, after ex­
penses had been taken out of the 
gross.

Kahn yesterday afternoon filed 
a night letter through Western 
Union to Chris Dundee, one of 
Roach’s managers. The gist of the 
message was that Lubbock, the 
South Plains and West Texas was 
proud of him, wanted to see him 
fight, but could not go to New 
York. The wire also stated that 
such a fight, staged here in June, 
would draw a capacity gate and 
that proceeds would help the Boys 
Club go over the top in its finan­
cial drive.

The telegram also urged him to 
name his own date, gave him a 
guarantee of $7,500, transportation 
and Lubbock expenses and wished 
him luck in his fight against Mar­
cel Cerdan of France in Madison 
Square Garden on March 12.

Roach’s ability is well known to 
Texas fight fans, but McDowell is 
only fairly well known, although 
he also comes from the Lone Star 
state. He has fought such out­
standing clouters as Kid Azteca, 
Midget Mexico, Kid Chocolate, 
Tami Mauriello and others.

One of McDowell’s greatest 
fights, the one in which he came 
closest to reaching the top, was 
with Tami Mauriello in Patterson, 
N.J. six years ago. McDowell ob­
viously was winning the first seven 
rounds when, in the eighth canto 
he began to clown. Mauriello 
knocked McDov/ell down, but in­
stead of recovering, McDowell 
started crawling for the ropes. The 
referee immediately halted the 
fight, although the Texan pro­
tested that he had been clowning 
and was not hurt.

The proposed fight, if staged in 
the mammoth new Tech stadium, 
could accommodate a crowd of ap­
proximately 40,000 persons. It 
would draw fans from the entire 
South Plains and probably an even 
larger area.

Motion picture companies al­
ready have signified an interest in 
taking films, while broadcast 
rights would also be obtained.

It would be Lubbock’s biggest 
fight since Babe Ritchie met Max 
Baer at the Panhandle-South 
fairgrounds.

GEM THEAIRE
Toamm, tbxas

Admission 12c A  SOe—Tax Ine.

Basketball Season Ends! Meeting Held Monday
The last verse of the last chap- j PaV O FS R o a d  P r o g r a m  

ter to Quitaque’s basketball has | 
been written for the season of

Thursday-Friday Mar. 4-5
“The Angel And 

The Badman”
John Wayne, Irene Rich 

Short: BROOKLYN U. S. A- 
Pathe News

Saturday Mat. & Night Mar. 6
Santa Fe Uprising
Allan Hale, Bobby Blake 

Also Selected Short Subject 
Chapter 9 of SERIAL

Sunday-MondAy March 7-8
Magic Town

James Stewart, Jane Wyman 
Also Selected Short Subject

Tuesday-Wednesday March 9-10
Fabulous Suzanne

Barbara Britton, Rudy Vallee 
Short: VIEW OF MISSOURI, NO. 3

1947-48.
On last Friday morning at 9:30 

the girls squad, minus Roxie Price 
who remained home on account of 
illness in the family, and Melba 
Jo Woods who was on a mired bus 
some miles from town when we 
left.

We reached Amarillo a little aft­
er 12 p.m. where the group lunch­
ed. We were scheduled to play at 
3:00 p.m. and reached White Deer 
gym at 2:30. The girls were hur­
ried into play soon after getting 
into playing togs. In a strange at­
mosphere with little time to look 
about and relax the players started 
the game under strong handicaps. 
Prom the beginning fouls were 
handed them thick and fast. We 
would not claim that we were dis­
criminated against, for on the 
whole it seemed that the Dimmitt 
teams got as many penalties as did 
ours, but it seemed that the fire 
was concentrated on two or three 
of the Quitaque sextette especially 
the guards. Both the Barretts were 
off by the half. Una Lee Duck who 
has played well on the B team all 
season was sent on for Sue, and Jo 
Bedwell who has been a good for­
ward for the B’s had to do her best 
as substitute for Reba Jo.

At the half, the lassies in gold 
were 9 points behind, but, having 
found themselves began clinibing 
on their opponents. Early in the 
4th quarter the score was 23 to 25 
Dimmitt, and the game ended 24- 
28 for Dimmitt.

Near the end of the meelee the 
gals were cheered by the appear­
ance of “Lob” , “Proff’  ̂ Ken, Bob­
by Jack and Earnest.

At the close of the afternoon 
games the squad, including the 
boys, drove back to Panhandle for 
dinner (supper), where all enjoy­
ed themselves. At 7 p.m. we were 
back at White Deer where three 
good games were watched

At 12:30 Saturday night all 
were back in Amarillo. There the 
squad put up at Amarillo Hotel. 
The coach and bus driver, Travis 
Morrison, went straight off to bed 
leaving the gals to be looked after 
by Mrs. A. L. Morris and Mrs. Orlin 
Stark who had very obligingly 
gone along for that purpose. Of 
course the girls were altogether 
capable of taking care of them­
selves and needed no “looking af­
ter” . But all were happy and 
thankful to have two of the moth­
ers along. 9:30 a.m. Saturday 
found us all in the hotel coffee 
shop where a good breakfast was 
enjoyed by each one. Leaving Am­
arillo about 11:30 we arrived back 
at the home city in due time.

We pronounce the trip well 
worth all it cost in time, effort and 
money.

Girls on the squad were Sue and 
Reba Jo Barrett, Jareene Hol­
comb, Patsy Stark, Alpha Mae Mc- 
Pall, Ima Lee Morris, Una Lee 
Duck, Jo Dean Bedwell and Paul- 
ita McCracken, Jimmie Faye Wit­
cher.

Real finish to basketball ’47-’48 
was written Tuesday night when 
picked men from the schools in 
this district assembled at Quitaque 
gym for the all-district game. Not 
all the schools were represented 
but enough for a fine game and 
some lesser ones on the side. A big 
crowd attended and a good time 
was had. The “West” trounced the 
“East” to the tune of 69 to 36. Tra­
vis Morrison and Mr. Bingham 
refereed.

A fair size group responded 
Monday afternoon to the mass 
meeting called to discuss a road 
bond election. Of the thirty-five or 
so men who attended, fanners and 
business men were represented 
about equally. Only one or two ex­
pressed themselves' publicly, but 
most of those present at the meet­
ing registered approval of the pro­
ject.

Mr. Potts of Floydada, resident 
engineer for the state highway de­
partment, was present and ex­
plained the procedure for securing 
aid and the setup under the state 
highway department’s plan to as­
sume part of the expense of build­
ing farm-to-market roads, and 
the maintenance of them.

In explaining the setup, Mr. 
Potts spoke very favorably of the 
plan. He stated that the counties 
got a real bargain as the highway 
departhient furnished one-fourth 
of expense of building the road, 
furnished the engineering re­
quirements, and the upkeep. The 
last item in itself was quite a sav­
ing as it released to the counties, 
funds now needed for upkeep of 
the road, for maintenance of oth­
er roads, resulting in more im­
proved roads all round.

The project under consideration 
is 7 miles of paving, from the west 
corner of Main street in Quitaque 
south to the county line, and from 
the end of the new strip of paving 
at Gasoline south to the county 
line.

It was estimated that the 7 miles 
of paving under consideration 
would cost around $8,000 per mile, 
or $56,000. With the state highway 
department paying part of the 
costs, a bond issue of around 
$45,000 would furnish the funds re­
quired by the road district.

Further discussion revealed that 
this road district had retired bonds 
only last year (1947) and that tax­
es had been reduced. It was stated 
that the district could, wluho-Tft 
undue strain, take care of the bond 
issue needed for the new paving. 
Taxpayers in the road district 
could estimate the cost to them of 
of the proposed bond issue would 
be 10c on the $100 above what 
their taxes were in 1946.

Mr. Potts explained that a pe­
tition carefully drawn up to des- 
scrilbe construction planned, and 
location of the roads, ^ d  bearing 
the prescribed number of signa­
tures of qualified voters, was the 
first step in the project. This was 
ordered done at the meeting. He 
also stated that the district high­
way engineer had already heard 
some discussion of this project and 
viewed it with favor. He was of the 
opinion that the state commission 
would pass their approval.

Thursday-Friday Mar. 11-12
Dark Delusion

Lucille Bremer, James Craig 
Short: TENNIS IN RHYTHM 

Pathe News

METHODIST YOU'TH MEETING 
HERE MARCH 9TH

The Quitaque Methodist young 
people, with the help of the WSCS 
are to be hosts to the young peo­
ple’s Sub-District meeting next 
Tuesday evening (March 9) at 
7:30. This is an interesting and 
beneficial meeting and all local 
young people are urged to attend.

We are glad of what these meet­
ings have meant and what can 
mean to our young people as a step 
toward better training for more 
efficient Christian service.

The public is invited.

A good well of excellent quality 
was brought in at about 135 feet, 
on the J. T. Persons place on the 
highway west of town and Mr. 
Persons reported this week that 
plans were progressing on their 
home which they planned to build 
there in the immediate future.

HAND BADLY LACERATED
Harold Lewis was seriously in­

jured Monday afternoon while op­
erating the electric saw at the 
Willson & Son lumber yard. Harold 
was sawing a piece of plank in 
which there was a large knot. 
When the saw blade struck the 
knot, the board split in two, one 
end was thrust into his chest. In­
stinctively, he threw out his hand 
which struck the saw blade.

The thumb and first finger of 
his left hand were almost severed 
and he bled profusely, however he 
suffered more pain from the jab 
in the chest than from the lacer­
ated hand.

After receiving first aid treat­
ment here, Harold was taken to 
Piainview sanitarium, accompan­
ied by his mother and father, Mr. 
and Mrs. Alva Davis, and Alton 
Johnson. He remained in the hos­
pital for several days treatment 
Mrs. Davis staying there with him. 
He was reported to be getting al­
ong very well.

DOC CHANDLER VERY ILL 
AT PIAINVIEW HOSPITAL

W. V. (Doc) Chandler was taken 
to the Piainview sanitarium last 
Friday where he is quite a sick 
man. He suffered several heart at­
tacks and has been kept under an 
oxygen tent. All of his children 
have been called to his bedside. 
Bub Chandler of near San Fran­
cisco, Cal., arrived the first of the 
week, and a request through the 
Red Cross for an emergency fur­
lough for Joe Chandler, who is in 
Gertmany, has been granted. Doc, 
who is 69 years old, has been re- 

j markably healthy all of his years, 
and this is his first illness.

City-School Elections 
First Week In April

Two important local elections 
will be held in Quitaque next mon­
th. A city election on the first 
Tuesday in April and a school 
election on the first Saturday in 
April. The posting of these election 
dates imposes upon every citizen of 
the town and school district a dis­
tinct responsibility.

There is lots of criticism (and 
very little praise) every day of the 
operation of the duties of the city' 
council and the school board. Un­
less you exercise your privilege of 
expressing your choice in the se­
lection of the men who serve on 
these boards, you should not criti­
cise their actions.

Give these coming elections ser­
ious consideration. They are im­
portant to you. Do your part to put 
in office men you think will serve 
best.

In order to be printed on the 
school ballots, names of candidates 
must be submitted to the County 
School Superintendent (Judge J. 
W. Lyon, Jr.) ten days before the 
date set for the election, which is 
Saturday, April 3. The present 
school board is composed of George 
Owens, president; Bert Grundy, 
Alton Johnson, Joe Bedwell, Jim 
Mayfield, J. T. Persons and J. K. 
Patrick. The terms of George 
Owens and J, K. Patrick expired 
this year, and two members will be 
elected to fill their places. You are 
urged to give this careful attent­
ion and to submit your choice to 
the county superintendent so that 
the names may be printed on the 
ballot.

Four members will be chosen for 
the city council this year, to fill 
the four vacancies left by the ex­
piration of the terms of Mayor M. 
L. Roberson, and Councilmen Roy 
Burgess, I. G. Grundy and Orlin 
Stark. Other members of the city 
council are W. J. Rice and Frank 
Gillespie. Names to appear on the 
city ballots should be presented to 
the city secretary.

FARM MEETING AT PLAINVIEW 
TO DISCUSS WATER SITUATION

The Texas Farm Bureau Federa­
tion will sponsor a water hearing 
to be held at Piainview on March 
8, it was announced today by J. 
Walter Hammond of Tye, state 
Farm Bureau president. The hear­
ing is scheduled for the purpose of 
studying the underground and sur­
face water situation in Texas and 
to discuss the desirability of un­
derground water control legisla­
tion, Hammond said. The meeting 
will begin at 10:00 a. m. in the 
City Auditorium.

W. R. Tilson of Meadow, state 
Farm Bureau director of the Plains 
area, will be host for the hearing. 
Farm Bureau Directors Joe M. 
Hatton of Amarillo and C. H. De- 
Vaney of Coahoma will be co- 
chairmen, with Hatton presiding 
during the morning session and 
DeVaney at the afternoon session.

In explaining the purpose of the 
hearing, Hammond said, “In the 
last session of the legislature, 
there was an effort made to pass 
legislation to regulate the use of 
underground water. The measure 
failed of passage because there was 
insufficient information to deter­
mine what legislation, if any, 
should be enacted. Therefore, the 
board of directors of the Texas 
Farm Bureau believe it advisable 
to sponsor a hearing to seek in­
formation as to the available sup­
ply of surface and underground 
water, with an eye to making the 
best possible use of the water sup­
ply to meet the approval of the 
pre.sent and potential water users.”

MUSIC RECITAL
Music students of Mrs. C. E. Bed- 

well will be presented in a recital 
next week, the junior pupils pre­
senting their program on Wednes­
day, March 10 at 2:45 in the after- 

I noon at the school auditorium. The 
senior recital will be Friday after­
noon, March 12, at 2:45, also in the 
school auditorium.

The public is cordially invited 
to both of these recitals.

Mrs. Bedwell will present her 
students in their final recital for 
this term on May 7.

It’s Red Cross Time
The 1948 Red Cross Fund Drive 

began March 1st., and it is hoped 
that the $1000.00 goal will be 
reached before the final date of 
March 31.

Of the funds raised, 43.1 of 
the money will remain in the 
county for home use, while 56.9% 
is turned over to the National Red 
Cross Chapter to be used by them 
during times of national disaster 
and in other Red Cross work.

The money which is retained in 
Briscoe County by the County 
Chapter is used to good advantage 
on needy case sarising in our home 
communities. Under the capable 
supervision of Mrs. G. W. Seaney 
as Home Service Chairman and her 
Assistant Mrs. Gladys Wise of 
Quitaque, $821.64 was used by the 
local chapter last year to help 
needy cases, to extend loans to de­
serving people, and to assist more 
than a dozen service boys or vete­
rans in securing emergency fur­
loughs or getting discharges from 
service, securing hospitalization 
or disability aid in various ways.

Mrs. D. T. Northeutt, County Red 
Cross Chapter Treasurer, Mrs. G. 
W. Seaney and Mrs. Gladys Wise, 
Home Service Chairman make the 
following report on local help 
which was given by the County 
Chapter last year.

Eight families were assisted in 
getting medical aid or other neces­
sities in the amount of $312.73.

Four loans were made by the lo­
cal chapter in the amount of 
$134.16.

Under the directions of W. Cof­
fee, Jr., chairman of the disaster 
Committee, The Local Red Cross 
Chapter also gave assistance to the 
cyclone stricken town of Higgins 
last year. Three truck loads of 
clothing and other supplies were 
gathered and sent to the stricken 
area and $362.90 in money was 
sent in by the Briscoe County 
Chapter of the Red Cross to be 
used to help relieve the disaster 
victims.

County Fund Campaign Chair­
man Leo White announces the fol­
lowing Community Chairman and 
workers have been appointed to 
work with him in the 1948 Fund 
Drive. Your help and co-operation 
in working with these people is 
urged. Let us all do our part to 
make this 1948 Drive a great suc­
cess.

Marion Roberson, chairman, 
Quitaque.

Silverton: Dee McWilliams,
Chairman, Mr. and Mrs. Judd Don­
nell, J. E. (Doc) Minyard, Mrs. 
JiaDJnie Stevenson, Bud Perkins, 
Mr. and Mrs. Billie Wood, Mr. and 
Mrs. Shafe Weaver, Rev. G. A. El­
rod, Wm. F. Talley.

J. L. Self, Haylake; W. E. Helms, 
Gasoline; Tom Pierce, Kent and 
others in the Silverton area.

DOG WARNS OF FIRE DANGER
The home of Mr and Mrs Park 

Bolton, a few miles north of the 
highway, east of Quitaque, was 
very likely saved from destruction 
by fire last week, by the alertness 
of their small pet dog. The littie 
tan feist which they befriended 
about four years ago, sleeps in the 
house and one morning last week, 
Mrs. Bolton was awakened by the 
animal whining and pulling at the 
bedclothes.

She opened her eyes to discover 
the roottii black with smoke. Mr. 
Bolton had arisen earlier, lighted 
the oil stove in the kitchen and 
returned to bed and to sleep.

When the dog awakened her, she 
called Mr. Bolton and when they 
opened the kitchen door, they 
found that room black with soot 
and over the stove it appeared that 
a great cloud of soot and smoke was 

[boiling with streaks of fire shoot­
ing from it. She threw open the 
window and turned out the fires 
in the store. However, it was re­
ported, that the blaze in the burn­
ers did not appear to have run up, 
but it seemed that gas had formed 
the ball of' cloud over the stove and 
if it had exploded the whole house 
would have burst into flames.

They were fortunate the little 
dog alarmed them when it did. Ev­
ery room in the house, it was stat­
ed, was stained with smoke and 
soot.

Bobby Morris becam,e very ill 
Sunday and Monday was taken to 
the hospital a.t Memphis for exam­
ination. Tests were still being run 
on Bobby’s condition Wednesday 
and the doctors had not reported 
what they thought was his trouble.

BE SURE YOU’RE RIGHT 
WHEN YOU TURN LEFT

You have to keep left to be right, 
according to W. J. Elliott, Chief of 
the Texas Highway Patrol.

“But let me tell you what I 
mean, before you think I sound 

j mixed up” he said. “A left turn in 
heavy traffic is one of the most 
difficult maneuvers in an auto­
mobile, and it causes traffic tie- 
ups and accidents when bungled.”

Chief Elliott said that the Texas 
Highway Patrol is cooperating in 
a nationwide “Know and Obey 
Traffic Laws” program and he cit­
ed National Safety Council stat­
istics to show the need for such a 
program.

At least 3% per cent of all fatal 
pedestl'ian and non-pedestrian ac­
cidents involve a turning vehicle, 
and improper turning was reported, 
in from 4 to 5 per cent of all ac­
cidents.

Pointing out that about twice as 
tnany turning accidents involve 
left turns as right turns. Captain 
Polk Ivy of the Amarillo District 
listed five rules to remember in 
making a left turn.

1. Keep next to the centerline or 
center of the roadway, so that no 
car will approach from behind on 
your left as you turn.

2. Turn around two points, one 
where the center of the street or 
road you are on meets the crossr 
walk or property line, and the oth­
er where the center of the street 
or road you are turning into leaves 
the crosswalk or property line.

3. Start to get in the proper lane 
for turning far enough back, at 
least a block before the turn.

4. Use hand signals before mak­
ing the turn and be sure to make 
a full turn. Don’t cut corners!

5. Always respect the right of 
way of other drivers who are at 
the intersection or approaching 
so close as to be a hazard.

Mrs. Berna Stewart went to Dal­
las last week and gave a blood 
transfusion to her sister Miss 
Evelyn Cain who is in Baylor hos­
pital there. A cousin from Okla­
homa also gave some blood. Elvelyn 

i is getting along nicely.

WEATHER NOTES
Prevailing weather this weel 

has been cold and up until Thurs 
day morning, little moisture ha 
developed. However, the m,ercr 
was way down Thursday morn 
sleet was falling and the gre 
was icy and slippery underfoc ’

Clouds were heavy last 
with a little moisture fallir 
the skies clearing over th 
end.

Moisture through Febr 
corded by the governrr 
was as follows:

Feb. 1-7, .75 inch; 
none; Feb. 21-27, .73 
from Feb. 27 to Mar. 
inch. Totaling 1.54 ;

HERE WITH PARE!
Elsker Curtis broi 

and returned heim.e 
Johnny Cagle from 
week and Mrs. Curt 
parents Mr. and Mrs. 
recovering her health 
cent serious illness. E 
a few days and return.

QUITAQUE, TEXAS 
Admission 12c 4s 30c—Tax

Thursday-Friday Mar.
This Time For Keeps

Technicolor
Esther Williams, Jimmy Durante, 

Johnny Johnston
Short:
HAVE YOU EVER WONDERED? 

Saturday Mat. & Night Mar. 6
Thunder Mountain

Tim Holt—In Zane Grey’s Story 
Short: TELEVISION TURMOIL 

First Chapter of’̂ New Serial

Sunday-Monday March 7-8
“The Secret Life 
of Walter Mitty”

Technicolor
Virginia Mayo, Danny Kaye, 

Faye Bainter, Ann Rutherford 
Short: GOLF DOCTOR

Tuesday-Wednesday March 9-16
The Imperfect Lady
Ray Milland, Teresa Wright 

Short: PIN GAMES 
Paramount News

Thursday-Friday Mar. 11-12
The Long Night

Henry Fonda, Barbara Bel Geddes, 
Vincent Price, Ann Dvorak 
Short: QUAIL POINTERS
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“  LOCALS
Mr. and Mrs. Earnest Morrison 

visited relatives at Dumas over the 
week end.

Dee Smith of Plainview visited 
his parents Mr. and Mrs. W. A. 
Smith last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Truman Bradshaw 
of South Plains visited his father 
T. L. Bradshaw and otl^er relatives 
last week. ■
FOR SALE—6-fl  ̂ ^ervel 1937 mod­
el, in good coi^ition,' $235.00.— N̂. 
V. Hamilton, Quitaque. 6tfc

Mr. and Mrs. E. W, Scheid and 
Mark Stacy visited friends in Am­
arillo Sunday.

Miss Barbara Jo Persons, who 
has been working in Amaillo for 
several months has returned home.

Miss Ina Ruth Morrison has re­
turned home from Dumas where 
she had been, working for several 
months.

Mrs. Sophia Tibbetts of Plain-

what’s the hurry?
Slow down and enjoy yourself. 
Come in and let us fix you up 
with a good hot meal. Well 
serve you lots or little—^whatever 
you like.

Fresh Fish Every Monday & Thursday 

Pleasing You Keeps Us In Business. 

M O D E R N  C A F E
GENE CHANDLER

Look Over These 
Good Values

And see the NEW  ITEMS for Spring and 
Summer at Roberson Dry Goods.

SPECIAL!
Clearance Of

Men’s Suits 
100% Wool

ular price up to $37.50 
Vhile they last —

$25.00

Coats
a few men’s and 

,s left and we are 
them 25%.
20.00 Value

mly $15.00
Reduced Accordingly.

Pants
ens All Wool Gaberdine 

egular $14.95 Pants, only

$ 1 0 .0 0

Coveralls
We have one number in mens 
coveralls that we are closing 
out at $2.98. Look Again—

Only $2.98

Shoes
We have a complete stock of 
men’s dress oxfords, all sizes 
and widths; mens work shoes 
Friedman-Shelby & Wolver­
ine.

SPECIAL
Ladies Dresses 

%  Price
These dresses were from $5.95 
to $19.95—Special price now 
$2.48 to $9.98.

We have just received a 
New Shipment of

Ladies Hats For 
Spring & Summer

Priced From

$2.95 to $4.95 

Gibson Girl Ties
Yes we now have a nice 
assortment in plaids and sol­
id colors.

Ladies Purses
Just received a large selection 
of the latest thing in purses.

Slips
Mojud Crepe Slips in white 
and pink. These slips are 
made by the same manufac­
turer who makes Mojud Hose.

Shoes
We have just received anoth­
er shipment of new spring 
sihoes—slings, sandals and 
oxfords.

Bates Bedspreads
We have a new assortment of 
BATES bedspreads priced—

$6.95 to $25.00

SPECIAL
Ladies Suits

We have a number of ladies 
suits we are reducing 25%. 
Regular price from $22.50 to 
$32.50. Special price is from

$16.90 to $24.40

Roberson Dry Goods
READY TO WEAR FOR MEN, WOMEN AND CHILDREN

view was here last week visiting 
her son Elmer and family and in 
the home of Mrs. H. C. Kell.
CAFE FOR SALE— N̂ice, clean, do­
ing good business, well located.— 
Oliver Payne, Quitaque. 7-2

Mr and Mrs. C. R. Badgett went 
to Plainview Tuesday morning, 
where she had a recheck at the 
sanitarium.

Mr. and Mrs. Ordis Chandler, 
Pearl Maurice and Betty visited 
over the week end with friends in 
Anson.

Mrs. F. M. Sachse spent several 
days last week with her daughter 
Mrs. Myrl Graham and family at 
Silver ton.

Burl, young son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete Clark was taken to the Plain- 
view sanitarium Monday where he 
underwent an appendectomy. 
SEVERAL NEW R.C.A. RADIOS — 
just received. R.C.A. is ^oted for its 
superior tone and long life.Prices 
$25.00 up. Terms if desired.—Pion­
eer Pharmacy.

The two young sons of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Bradley have been ill, 
and Tillman has been several 
weeks out of school because of 
sickness.

Dinner guests of the Leon Bar­
hams were Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Setliff and daughter of Plainview, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ray Cruse and 
son.

Dinner guests of the Ralph Car­
ters Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Bedwell and son of 
Plainview, and Mr. and Mrs. J. R. 
Lusk and children.

Mrs. P. T. Clark and baby came 
in Friday from their home in 
Arizona for a visit with her par­
ents Mr. and Mrs. Robert Patrick 
and ether relatives.

Orlin Stark left Tuesday morn­
ing for Dallas where he will serve 
on the State Advisory Committee 
for the Farm Home Administrat­
ion. He will return Thursday. 
BETTER VACCINATE those calves. 
Don’t bet a $100 calf against 10c. 
Franklin Bacterin, covers Blackleg 
and Malignant Edema in a single 
10c dose.—Pioneer Pharmacy.

A son weighing seven pounds 
was born February 22 to Mr. and 
Mrs. George Hulsey, Jr., at Mount 
Vernon, Wash. The youngster was 
named Gary Wayne.

Stewart McCracken, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Boone McCracken has 
been absent from school several 
days the past week due to a severe 
throat ailment. He thought he was 
a little better Wednesday morning.

Mrs. H. B. Finney returned home 
Friday from Houston where she 
has been attending her sister Mrs. 
L. D. Watkins who is seriously ill. 
She reported that her sister’s con­
dition was unimproved and there 
is slight hope for her recovery.

Jackie Bass was here last week 
from Fort Worth visiting relatives 
and friends. Jackie said he and his 
parents were well pleased with

POLITICAL ANNOUNCEMENTS
The following political an­

nouncements are subject to action 
of the Democratic Primary, July 24, 
1948:
For County Judge and ex_Officio 
County Superintendent:

J. W. LYON, JR.
(Re-Election

For Sheriff, Assessor & Collector:
BRYAN STRANGE

(Re-Eilection)
For County Clerk:

DEE MCWILLIAMS
(Re-Election 

For County Treasurer:
A. G. STEVENSON

(Re-Election)
For Commissioner Precinct 2:

E. A. PUCKETT
B. K. (Kerr) HAMILTON
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Merrell Food & Produce
PHONE 5-M Quitaque, T ^ a s

1 Friday & Saturday Specials
1 Swift’s Meat Steak BRER RABBIT

For Babies Brown Label
Can —  22c Loin and T-Bone 5-lh jar —  55c

ORANGE JUICE 
Nuzest

Ib —  55c POST
Corn Toasties

46-oz. can —  27c Navonaise 18-oz. box —  24c

ASHLEY’S Best Maid DILL PICKLES
Tortillas Qt. —  51c Quart

Can —  75c 15c

SORGHUM Flour EMBOSSED
SYRUP NAPKINS

5-lh Bucket Everlite 60 to bundle
85c 25-lh bag —  1.85 9c

Bring Us Your Cream & Eggs
their new home near Fort Worth. 
He left Wednesday to return home.

Victor Hall returned last Thurs­
day from Oklahoma City where he 
received delivery of a 1948 Olds- 
mobile for Hall Motor Co. Victor 
kept the new car as a demonstrat­
or and sold the 1947 model to El­
mer Tibbetts.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Morrison re­
turned their daughter and hus­
band, Mr. and Mrs. Son Washing­
ton home to Springlake Sunday, 
making a pleasant round trip of 
the afternoon.
ONE used Servel refrigerator; 1 
roll of new inlaid linoleum; 1 new 
7-ft, Philco refrigerator. — Turkey 
Hardware. 7~lc

Billie Frank Rhoderick was here 
this week from Morton for a visit 

I with his parents Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
i Rhoderick and to be with his sister 
I and small niece, Mrs. Clayton 
j Johnson and Tommie Lou visiting

frqfrn Brownsville. Billy Frank is 
conducting an army surplus store 
at Morton.
FOR SALE—1947 New Holland Au­
tomatic Hay Baler.—OdelL Gregg, 
Plainview, Texas, phone 1636W. 7-2

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to thank all who helped 

us in any way in the loss of our 
dear one. Each kind act, each 
word of consolation and sympathy, 
the beautiful flowers and every­
thing done for us, is deeply appre­
ciated.

Mr. and Mrs. L. E. Pointer 
and Family.

Just Received Carload Of —  

GRADE-MARKED —  KILN DRIED

Yellow Pine 
Lumber

Plenty Of No. 1 and No. 2 
CEDAR SHINGLES

iY

•v

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express our apprecia­

tion to the kind friends who were 
so helpful through the long illness 
and passing of our loved one. We 
thank all those who assisted us in 
caring for him and who helped in 
so many ways, for the food and 
flowers, and the sympathy shown 
us.

Children and Grandchildren of 
Uncle Alex Lyles.

3’s

CORRUGATED IRON

STOCK TUBS 
-  4’s —  5’s —  6’s —  7’s —  8’s

Willson & Son
“Where Most People Trade” Quitaque

Dr. Bazil Noble, O. D.
OPTOME’TRIST 
Glasses Fitted 

Offices at 103 Ave C—NE 
Childress, Texas

Dr. J. M. Shy
PHYSICIAN & SURGEON 

Res. Phone 53-M Off. Phone 70 
Quitaque, Texas

Dr. M. F. Achor
OSTEOPATHIC PHYSICIAN 

AND SURGEON 
Turkey, Texas

Dr. J. E. GarnerI
j PHYSICIAN AND SURGEON 

Turkey, Texas

W HEN YOU ARE GIVEN A

Prescription
BY YOUR PHYSICIAN

Bring it to the PIONEER PHARMACY and have it 
filled with confidence. The department has been re­
newed and made up to date and new items are added 
as they are proven of value.

All Prescriptions are filled by a Registered Pharmacist, 
registered by examination in 1907.

Yours for correct Rx work and prices.

Pioneer Pharmacy
C. R. BADGETT, Registered Pharmacist
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New B-15
Bomber Jackets

You Can’t Beat This For 
A Warm Jacket

ENAMEL DISHPANS 
Round and Oblong

HEAVY CHINA W EAR  
Cups —  Saucers —  Sugar Bowls

LARGE TOOL BOXES
FISHING TACKLE BOXES

BOX END WRENCHES

Please Notice: Our store at Turkey is open 
every day; the store at Quitaque is open on 
Fridays and Saturdays.

Army Surplus Store
FAMILY REUNION

A pleasant family reunion was 
enjoyed at the Ed Dunavant home 
Sunday, when most of their child­
ren and grandchildren were there 
for the day, making twenty-two 
present for a pleasant dinner and 
visit.

They were Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 
Melton and children of Panhandle, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Hyman and 
children and Mrs. Florence Tipps 
and children of Amarillo, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Gibson and baby of 
Turkey, Mr. and Mrs. Dunavant 
and son Teddy.

■ «

4 ^ .

HIGH BLOOD PRESSURE CAUSE
Has Been Discovered

And a Medicine has been formulated in a single tablet to 
be taken orally in your own home, no dieting, no restric­
tions of any kind; after being examined and all symptoms 
recorded, take the medicine as directed for thirty days, and 
if not satisfied, return, be re-examined and if there is no 
reduction in blood pressure, your money for medicine and 
professional service will be returned. Records of all cases 
are kept and are open to inspection by any one who cares 
to investigate. This is a new discovery. Write or phone for 
farther information.

E, H. BOAZ, M. D.
MORGAN HOSPITAL

PHONE Sm CHILDRESS. TEXAS PO. BOX 827

n v.'iiere 1 sit ....^ Joe Marsh

How to Put Up with 
Women's Styles

When Will Dudley’s mis.sus finally 
gave in to the new-style longer 
.skirts. Will was mighty critical at 
first. Allowed as how women were 
a slave to fashion. . .  ought to dress 
to please their husbands and not 
style designers.

Sue finally reminded Will of his 
habit of sitting by the radio Sat­
urday afternoons in shirt sleeves 
and old slippers, listening to the 
sportcasts with a mellow glass of 
beer. Suggested that maybe Will 
was a slave to comfort.

And Will admitted she was right.

Perhaps the way somebody dresse.s 
isn’t always to our taste—just as 
Will’s glass of beer may be another 
person’s cider.

But from where I sit, those little 
differences aren’t important— un­
less we go out of our way to make 
them so, by being hypercritical. 
As Will says now; “ Well, anyway, 
those long skirts hide a multitude 
of shins” . . .  and lets it go at that!

This And That About 
One Thing and Another

One—only one—.masculine read­
er of The Post has told us that he 
like the “This and That” business. 
But he said, he wasn’t too interest­
ed in the recipes, though he did 
renew his subscription and said 
he didn’t want to miss a copy of 
the paper. Perhaps, he thinks we 
will improve on the column—or 
the recipes will improve his wife’s 
cooking. But the ladies (far and 
near) like the recipes. Here is a 
much appreciated letter from Mrs. 
Cleota Burns (former Cleota Rog­
ers) from Bell, Calif., who says 
she thinks we have “a wonderful 
idea for getting the recipe column 
started,” and she sends some inter_ 
esting recipes, you will surely want 
to try.

We are so crowded for space in 
our little paper, we can’t get in all 
the gossip we know and the recipes 
too, so we have to skip around and 
try to please *some readers one 
week, and others the next week. 
Someday we hope to have enough 
help in the shop and newsprint 
on hand to increase the size of our 
paper. So in case the recipes get 
left out for a week, don’t despair, 
they will get back in.

Mrs. Burns has many friends 
here who will be interested to 
know that her husband is teach­
ing handicraft at South Gate Jun­
ior High School, and likes his job 
fine. She says “we are only 3-4 of 
a mile from school so Leslie sleeps 
until the last minute, and then 
leaves in one of those Bumstead 
rushes every morning” Mr. Burns 
graduated from the University of 
California at Santa Barbara on 
Feb. 1. They are both attending 
night classes twice a week for ex­
tension courses.

KIFFLIN COOKIES
—Minnie Mae Roberson 

1 lb. butter 1 qt. flour 
V2 cup sugar, or more if desired

sweeter.
IV2 cups nuts, chopped vanilla 

Have butter soft, add nuts and 
sugar and let stand several hours, 
if convenient. Add vanilla and 
flour and mix well. Make out on 
cookie sheet and cook 45 minutes, 
very slowly,

When done, take up and roll in 
powdered sugar while still hot.

Half this recipe makes lots of 
cookies.

Copyright, 1948, United States Brewers Foundation

Someone asked the other day, 
what we thought of the assassina­
tion of Gandhi and we didn’t have 
words to express our feelings. But 
someone else did, in the very words 
we would have used if we could. 
We don’t now who J. Loyd Rice is, 
but this clipping gives expression 
for himself, and thousands of oth­
ers:
THIS CHANGING WORLD

Gandhi is dead, but the spirit of 
a powerful leader lives on. The 
smoke of his funeral pyre has as­
cended, and may his influence 
thus ascend in the hearts and lives 
of leaders throughout the world.

Gandhi loved liberty, and was a 
man of peace. God give us more 
men of peace today. So many of 
the great leaders in the develop- 
nient of our civiliation have been 
warriors, that it is a relief to know 
of a man who could stand the 
pressure of an enemy invasion of 
his home land and resist only pas­
sively.

This little brown man of India 
was not a Christian according to 
our belief, yet he practiced more 
real Christianity than many who 
would brand him heathen. Gandhi 
might have been wrong in theory, 
but the evidence is that he was so 
right in practice. The leaders of 
the Catholic Church have often 
promoted wars, and protestant 
leaders have fought in the name 
of religion. Those claiming to fol­
low the Prince of Peace have left a 
bloody record of violent persecu-

Good Lumber
Higginbotham-Bartlett Co.

Successors to J. Cw Wooldridge Co.
H. Allen Bingham, Mgr. Quitaque

Figure With Us On Your Building Needs

City Grocery
Bert Grundy Quitaque, Texas

W ife (to husband reading): ‘T want to do some shop­
ping today if the weather permits. What does the paper 
forecast say?”

Husband: “Rain, hail, sleet, snow, thunder, light­
ning and fierce winds.”

Specials for Friday & Saturday
FITCH’S HAIR OIL, 25c size_________ 2 for 25c plus tax
MOBIL SPOT REMOVER, 8-oz______________________ 35c

Q  A  Sugar Cured —  Slab C C ®
We slice it —  l b _________ DO

JUMBO APPLE BUTTER, 38-oz. size_______________47c
PINEAPPLE, crushed, g a l ._________________________1.25

Tomato Juice 4 6 « z c a n .. 23^
BLACKBERRIES, No. 2 ca n ________________________ 19c
PIMIENTO PEPPERS, 7-oz. ca n ____________________10c

1 5  Thrift Mexican Style O  r*oeans 3 f o r__________ 25'
WHITE SWAN COFFEE, l b ________________________ 50c
SUGAR, 25-Ib b a g __________________________________ 2.35

Beef Roast  ̂ 39^
CARROTS, 2 bunches____ ___________________________ 15c

tion, hatred, and strife. Their in­
fluence is still so strong that 
Christianity today, in general, has 
lost its meaning, and most profes­
sors have not even begun to be 
Christian, but we call Gandhi pa­
gan.

It is sad indeed that a man of 
peace had to be murdered by the 
hand of one who believes in vio­
lence. It makes us think that per­
haps many more centuries will 
pass before the leaders of men will 
actually begin to follow Christ and 
practice Christianity in their deal­
ings with each other.—J. Loyd 
Rice.

G.A.’S MEET
The G. A.’s met Monday after­

noon. We enrolled a new member 
Peggy Peacock.

The standard of excellance chart 
was marked up to date. The girls 
practiced on the play to be pre­
sented at the church Sunday 
night.

Nine girls were present. They 
were: Peggy Peacock, Rochelle 
Craig, Gwendolyn Chase, Carol 
June Berry, Floretta Mae Stone, 
Jeanette Berry, Mattie Graham, 
Alpha Jean Allen, Mrs. A. E. Grag-

son and Earlette Grundy.

Mr. and Mrs. Archie Alexander 
and daughters Jo Jo and Mary 
Jane, of Big Spring, accompanied

by Mr. Pruitt also of Big Spring, 
were here over the week end visit­
ing Mrs. Alexander’s parents Mr. 
and Mrs. W. C. Womack, and other 
relatives and friends.

PLAINVIEW  SANITARIUM & CLINIC
801-813 West Eighth Street Plainview, Texas

E. O. NICHOLS, M. D. 
Surgery and Consultation 

J. H. HANSEN, M. D. 
Surgery and Diagnosis 

E. O. NICHOLS, JR, M. D. 
General Surgery - Gynecology 

E. G. McCarthy, M. D. 
Obstetrics

W. C. GOODPASTURE, M. D. 
Gastro-Enterology and 

Internal Medicine

HUGH B. O’NEAL, M. D. 
Internal Medicine, Cardiology 
RANDALL E. COOPER, M. D. 
Nervous and Mental Diseases 
LANDRIA C. SMITH, M. D.

Internal Medicine 
CARL C. JACKSON, M. D. 
Eye, Ear, Nose and Throat 

RALPH W. WILLIAMS 
Director Physical Therapy 

Department

SUSIE RIGGS, R. N. 
Director Nursing Service

LEE B. SOUCY, M. T. (AS 
Director Laboratory Sen

H. E. COMSTOCK 
Administrator

X-RAY AND RADIUM — PATHOLOGICAL LABOR/ 
DEPARTMENT OF PHYSICAL THERAPY

B ̂  C Hardware Co.
QUITAQUE, TEXAS

Regular Price Now
BICYCLE, b o y s______________________ $ 49.95_____$ 39.95
BICYCLE, g ir ls ______________________$ 59.95_____$ 49.95
VACUUM C LE A N E R ______________ | 64.75_____$ 54.75
Pressure Cooker, 4-qt. W earever____ | 12.95_____$ 9.95
RADIO, Bendix table m odel_________ $ 32.50_____$ 17.95
Radio-Pbonograpb Comb. Crosley _ $112.75_____$ 89.95
TABLE L A M P S ____________________ $ 7 .75-__$  5.75
IRONING B O AR D S________________ $ 4.50_____$ 3.50
ALL KITCHEN W A R E S ______________________O ff 30%
ALL T O Y S _____________________________________O ff 50%
LISTER POINTS, Any Num ber_______________________ $ 3.25
GAS RANGE, Natural or Butane______________$212.00

ADMIRAL REFRIGERATOR, 9-Ft.

SEE US FOR YOUR
FERGUSON TRACTOR & IMPLEMENTS 

We will have a
NEW  FERGUSON TRACTOR ON DISPLAY 

in the very near future. Watch for this announcement.

mmmmmmmmmmmmmafKBmmmmmmmammmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmm



Mr. Farmer:
To Those of You Who Have Held 
Wheat or Milo —

We are ready at any time to serve you. When you are 
ready to sell, we are ready to bid you the latest market prices. 

Call on us for any service we may be able to render 
If you haven’t received your rain gauge, come in and 

ask for one. We have it for you.

Quitaque Elevator
— Phone

60 Office 80-B Residence

Wilson Kimble Optometric Clinic
Phone 254 FLOYDADA Write Box 518

SPECIALIZING IN EYE CARE AND VISUAL EFFICIENCY 
We maintain a modem Optical Laboratory for the Prompt 

and Accurate Filling of Opthalmic Prescriptions.
DR. JOHN W. KIMBLE, OPTOMETRIST

Those Large Beautiful 
MONUMENTS

You Have feen  Waiting For Have 
Arrived. Please Come To See Them.
SOUTH PLAINS MONUMENT CO.

401 W . 6th St. Plainview
OUR 32ND YEAR

LOCALS
Mr and Mrs. Joe King left their 

young son here last week for a vis­
it with his grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. D. C. Duck and family, and 
Saturday the grandparents took 
the youngster home to Cactus, re­

maining over Sunday for a visit.
Mr. and Mrs. P. C. Hamilton and 

sons of Plainview and Mr. and Mrs 
Noman Hamilton and daughter 
Noma Lou of Floydada visited over 
the week end with their mother 
Mrs. Clora Hamilton and other re­
latives and friends here.

HariDony
in a B iD s k a l print 
for the

"Forgotten Woman”

os seen in
Woman^s Home Companion

Other Martha Manning 
Dresses from $8.95

Martha Manning recognizes the 
fitting needs o f  the shorter, 
slighuy fuller figure . . .  and does 
something about it I Heres a 
now - into - summer dress with 
length-loving pleats. Black print 
on Concerto Blue, Allegro Aqua, 
R h^sody Pink, Libretto Lilac 
in Enka Rayon Sheer. Illusion 
sizes, 16)^-223^.

Salem Dry Goods

Cully Purcell of Sacramento, Cal. 
is here visiting his mother Mrs. U.
C. Purcell and other relatives. He 
stopped enroute for a visit with his 
grandchildren at Roswell, NM., 
and plans to be here about another 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. John Lindsey mov- 
i ed Saturday into the place on the 
highway east of town vacated by 
the Jim T. Witchers, who left 
Tuesday morning (after a few days 
delay) to make their home in 
California.

Mrs. Bill Middleton went to Tulia 
Saturday where she underwent an 
operation of an impacted wisdom 

* tooth. She was accompanied by 
Mrs. H. G. Gardiner, Mrs. E. A. 
Gragscn and Mrs. C. R Badgett

Mr. and Mrs. E. D. Richmond 
and boys were hosts Sunday at 
their home at Turkey to a dinner 
party honoring their mother Mrs. 
Mattie McCracken. Others enjoy­
ing the day and dinner were Mr. 
and Mrs. Boone McCracken and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. L. A. Mc­
Cracken and son, Miss Mary Ellen 
McCracken. Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Richmond visited in the afternoon. 
FOR SALE—1946 “DC” Case tract­
or and equipment, all in good 
shape.—Bob Eudy, Turkey, Rt. 
1. 7-2

Durwood Lewis took his mother 
and brother Mrs. Alva Davis and 
Carl Lee to Plainview Monday 
morning where the latter had a 
check at the sanitarium on the 
progress made by a leg which is 
healing nicely after a break. The 
doctors told Corky that he would 
be able to put his weight on the 
leg in about another two weeks.

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Hickey and 
children and Mr. and Mrs. Brig­
ham Young and children, all of 
Memphis spent Sunday here with 
relatives. The sisters and sisters- 
in-law went up to Silverton and 
spent the afternoon with Mrs. 
Bryant Eddleman. They enjoyed 
a pleasant visit figuring out who 
is The Walking Man.
FOR SALE—One Woolarac Deep 
Freeze Box, and other cafe equip­
ment. Phone No. 5, Flomot, Texas, 
Mrs. Harmon Moseley.

The families of Steve Mayfield 
and Bruce Price received messages 
from the boys Monday of this week 
advising them that they had ar­
rived back in the States, and ex­
pected to be home in about two 
weeks. Both boys are in military 
service and have been stationed in 
the Pacific area. Glen Ramsey also 
went into service at the same time 
and has been with them, so he is 
expected to arrive home with 
them.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Dunham of 
McAllen were here last week,visit­
ing relatives. They went to Phillips 
with their mother Mrs. Maude 
Dunham, Scott Dunham and fam­
ily and Buster Dunham and family 
of Silverton, where they visited 
another brother and sister, Sally 
Dunham and Mrs. Billie Gaston 
and daughter Thalia Ann. Their 
mother returned to Silverton with 
her sons to visit for another week 
while her apartment in Phillips is 
undergoing repairs.
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Seat Covers Sale
FIRST GRADE 

As Good As Money Will Buy

$ 16.95
Others as low-priced as $8.95

INSTALLED FREE

New Shipment of Bicycles—Both Boys 
and Girls—All Prices.

W HITE AUTO STORE - Turkey
his patients with confidence and 
assurance.

The little clinic in the legion 
building is growing right along 

! and patients are coming here from 
{ an ever widening territory.

; BIRTHDAY SUPPER ,
i A group of friends took a birth- 
' day cake and other good eats, and 
I went up to the Lawrence Bedwell’s 
i new home west of Plainview to 
help Mrs. Bedwell celebrate her 

j birthday last Friday. They return­
ed home that night—or the next 

j morning, and all reported a plea- 
j sant visit. Making the trip from 
j Quitaque were Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
j Hooks, Mr. and Mrs. Homer Gregg,
{ Mr. and Mrs. Leon Barham, Mr.
I and Mrs Odell Setliff and son, Mr 
and Mrs. Ralph Carter and child- 

I ren, Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Lusk and 
! children, Mrs. Brunson and Betty.
I Several friends from Plainview al- 
! so were present for the pleasant 
' occasion.

given a versity letter as manager 
and 29 other players will receive 
numeral sweaters for grid partici­
pation on the reserves or as var­
sity members without sufficient 
playing time to letter.

Included in the awards was 
Glenn Lewis, Quitaque, back.

ATTEND ZONE MEETING
A group of women from Quitaque 

attended the Methodist WSCS zone 
meeting at Turkey this week. Mrs. 
Victor Hall gave the morning de­
votional which was greatly enjoy­
ed. Mrs. Frank Hawkins is an offi­
cer of the group.

PHONE 54 TURKEY

TECH LETTER MAN
Lubbock,—Awarding of varsity 

; letters to 30 members of the 1947 
j Border conference football champ- 
I ionship team at Texas Techno- 
! logical College has been approved 
by the college atheletic council. In 
addition, Ed Orr, Vernon, has been

COLDS
U Q U ID  MEDICINE IS BETTER
Gti split-second relief of C o ld  M ise rie s  with 666 
the largest selling Liquid Cold Preporotion in the U . S.

L I Q U I D
n n n  c o ld  p r e p a r a t i o n

^ 1 ^  Coutfon Use only diractod

Lister Shares
TO FIT MOST BOTTOMS

Hot Water Heaters
For Home or Store Use.

Natural gas —  20 and 30 gallon capacity 
Butane gas —  20 gallon capacity

W e have a good stock of 
CAR, TRUCK AND TRACTOR

TIRES and TUBES
Let us figure with you on your tire needs.

Three Brothers
YOUR ALLIS CHALMERS DEALER

PHONE 77-J TURKEY

FUN WITH MUSIC
There was a big time in the old 

town last Thursday night, up in 
the Womack’s apartment. A group 
of musicians whom we’ll call the 
“King Players of the Queen City” 
gathered for a little revelry and 
music and entertained the Wom­
ack’s, and others within hearing 
distance, with some mighty fine 
music. The King Players include 
Earl Morrison at the piano, Cecil 
Purcell with the fiddle. Slick Mer- 
rell and his four string banjo, and 
Garrett Morrison, Johnny Cagle 
and Clark Payne, who all play 
electric guitars or other electric 
instruments. Oliver Payne who 
doesn’t play a musical instrument 
(except the juke box) tuned in 
with whistle and song.

Two amplifiers and two record­
ers were on hand, so several re­
cordings were made and played 
back for effect.

X-RAY LABORA’TORY
The new x-ray machine has been 

received and installed in the Shy 
clinic and is ready to operate. 
With the exception of the x-ray 
machinery at the Plainview clinic, 
this is the largest and best x-ray 
equipment in this part of the 
country, the doctor stated.

The laboratory includes a dark 
room and facilities for developing 
film, and with other laboratory 
equipment in his offices here. Dr. 
Shy says he has around $10,000 
worth of material which enables 
him to examine and prescribe for

Athletes Foot Germ
HOW TO KILL IT IN ONE HOUR

IF NOT PLEASED, your 35c back. 
Ask any druggist for this STRONG 
fungicide, TE-OL. Made with 90 per 
cent alcohol, it PENETRATES. 
Reaches and kills MORE germs 
faster. Today at

PIONEER PHARMACY

1948
Auto Tags

Must be on all cars by midnight of April 1, or owners 
will be subject to a fine and must pay a penalty for not 
buying their plates on time.

License tags may be put on at any time after they 
are purchased.

You must have certificates of title for registration 
or 1947 license receipt bearing same number as title.

You are to register your car in the county in which 
you live. This money goes for upkeep of county roads.

If you trade for a car, the papers are to be filled out 
within 10 days from date of assignment, else you are 
subject to a $5.00 penalty.

Bryan Strange
Sheriff, Tax Assessor and Collector,' Briscoe County


