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A SIGN OF THE TIMES.....Tumblin’ tumble weeds, sand, and strong winds again swept the Mulesboe area on Friday. 
This photo, taken just south of town, is typical of the destruction South Plains farmers are suffering from the wind 
damages this season.

Around

Muleshoe

On Tuesday. April 7 at 
7:30 p.m. at the High 
School Cafeteria parents of 
Title I and Title 1 Migrant 
students will gather for an 
evening of Bingo. Prizes 
fmliKtc three coniptbfe sets 
of the Young Students En­
cyclopedia, an electronic 
Spelling Bee and many 
other educational books, 
games and materials. 
There is no charge for the 
15 games and re­
freshments will be served. 

*****
Pothole patching is cur­

rently in progress on 
Kakawatc Road or Peanut 
Road. Watch out for open 
potholes, loose asphalt, 
and drifting sand when 
traveling on this road.

*****
The Youth Activities 

Committee will hold their 
regular meeting on Mon­
day. April 6 at 7 p.m. at 
the Bailey County Civic 
Center.

All interested persons 
arc urged to attend.

*****
Texas Tech University 

graduated 1.000 students 
at the end of the 1980 fall 
semester.

Degree recipients inclu­
ded: Gca/ul Hernandez, 
Marshall Pool. Dagmar 
Potccl. Bonnie Sain, and 
James Wcdel from this 
area.

*****

Coni. Page b. Col. I

Report Analyzes 
Reagan Spending

LIONS CLUB SWEET­
HEART.. ..Tena Landers, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Landers of Mule- 
shoe will compete in Dis­
trict 2T2 Lions Oub Queen

The U.S. Chamber of 
Commerce reports that an 
analysis of proposed bud­
get cuts shows they are 
aimed at wasteful spending 
itofliT ftths?’ truly m  need.

“ President Reagan's re­
commendations for spen­
ding reductions will in fact 
strengthen many of these 
programs by eliminating 
the fat and concentrating 
resources on legitimate 
applicants for help." the 
report concluded.

The business federa­
tion's analysis made these 
observations on specific 
programs:

Food Stamps. A 1977 
study by the General Ac-

Come and Go 
Set To Meet 
Family Needs

Mrs. James C. Golaz has 
announced sizes for per­
sonal needs of the 
Ruthardl family which 
could be brought to the 
come and go shower Tues­
day, April 7 from 7:00 to 
9:00 p.m. The shower is 
set for the Fellowship Hall 
of the First Assembly of 
God Church. 521 S. First 
Street.

The Jerry Ruthardt 
home was completely de­
stroyed by fire Monday, 
March JO.

Sizes for (he family in­
clude: Jerry: shirt, 15'/i; 
pants. 33-32; shoes 10'/j; 
Darlene: blouse or dress, 
large or 18; pants, 18. 
shoes 8'/i; Tina: blouse, 
small ladies; jeans. 28-32; 
shoes 7'/j; Jcdon: shirt, 14 
boys; pants, 28-30; shoes 
8; Paula: dress, blouse, 
pants size 8; and shoes 
5 Vi.

If you cannot attend the 
shower, household or 
clothing articles may be 
left at Linday and Jackcy 
Burris' trailer behind 223 
East Fifth or in the pas­
tor's office of the First 
Assembly of God Church, a 
money tree will be avail­
able.

The family is staying

counting Office found that 
12 percent of outlays re­
sulted from fraud, errors 
and misrepresentation by 
recipients. At current ex- 
'pCndiltirc rates, that would 
amount to SI .2 billion a 
year.

Jobless Benefits. The 
federal government spends 
SIM) million a year on 
jobless benefits for indi­
viduals who voluntarily 
leave the armed services at 
the same lime it spends 
similar sums on military 
recruiting.

Trade Adjustment. Most 
of the benefits of this 
program to help workers 
who have returned to work.

Black - Lung Compen­
sation. a General Accoun­
ting Office study found 
that sugstaniialing medical 
evidence was lacking in 
88.5 percent of approved 
claims.

Health Care. The presi- Coni. Page 7. Col. 5

Commisioners ’  Court 
In Special Session

Bailey County Commis­
sioner's Court met in spe­
cial session at their regular 
meeting place in the court­
house at 10 a.m. on April 
2nd.

Routine bills were paid 
and minutes of the last 
meeting were read and 
approved.

The court entertained a 
request bv the WIFE or­
ganization to sponsor a 
county-wide meeting on 
the water problems con­
fronting Bailey County.

It was ordered that a 
check in the amount of 
S500 payable to Deputy 
Sheriff Hal Bynum and 
wife, be approved for the 
expense of their transpor­
tation to Los Angeles. Ca. 
for the purpose of return­
ing an escaped prisoner, 
Janice Holmes, to Bailey 
County.

Oder was given that the 
county clerk be authorized 
to purchase a four drawer 
filing cabinet for the pur­
pose of safekeeping of ju-

center I night per week for 
square dancing at a rale to 
be set at a later dale.

Ed Edniiston. chief jailer 
was authorized to install a 
guardian light on the west 
side of the law enforce­
ment center in order to 
make the jail more secure.

An order was passed 
Coni. Page h. Col. 4 
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Mitch Autry 
In Tulsa 
Burn Center

Mitch Autry of Muleshoe 
is listed in critical condition 
in the Burn Center in 
Tulsa. Oklahoma.

Autry received extensive 
burns when his plan en­
tangled in some wires and 
collided with a pole and 
burned. He was crop 
spraying for the Longhorn 
Spraying Service of Mulc- 
slioc in Blackwell. Okla­
homa.

Mitch and his wife.

‘ Bailey Water’ Topic 
For April 13 Meeting

Area Meet Scheduled 
For Cattle Producers

WIFE, Commissioners 
Initiate Local Efforts

dent's program is designed 
to cut back health-care 
costs, which have out- 
spaced overall increases in 
the Consumer Price Index, 
and will not reduce amp* 
Coin Page 6. Col. 2

National 
Library Week

National Library Week 
will be observed at the 
Muleshoe Public Library 
April b-ll, with several 
activities planned. The 
theme of this year’s ob­
servation is "Libraries 
Help You Grow!!" and will 
be carried out in posters, 
bookmarkers, displays and 
balloons for children, 
which the Friends of the 
Library provide. “ Every­
one is cordially invited to 
v isit the library during this

Area beef cattle produ­
cers will have an opportu­
nity to gain information on 
a new breeding manage­
ment tool. Lulalysc. at a 
meeting to be held Tues­
day night. April 7 at 7:30 
pin. in the community 
room of the Muleshoe 
State Bank.

MX Opponents 
Set Workshop

MX opponents from 
Texas and New Mexico are 
invited to a workshop/in­
formation day, April II. at 
the Unitarian Church. 2104 
Jblft St. in Lubbock.

The U.S. Air Force has 
scheduled the Draft Envi­
ronmental Impact State­
ment hearings the follow­
ing Monday. The Saturday 
meeting will give oppo­
nents the chance to plan 
together. e*rb««ge infor­
mation and critiques of the 
DF.1S and to voice objec­
tions to the press.

Agenda topics include: 
MX System Overview, 
DEIS Critique. Question 
and Answer Period. Press 
Conference and the movie 
"W ar Without Winners". 
The movie is about the 
nuclear arms race from the 
Center of Defense Infor­
mation . an organization of 
retired military personnel 
and defense analvsisls.

Overnight lodging, child
Coni. Page 7. Col. 2

Assembly of God 
Schedules 

Family Concert
The Joel Perales Family 

known internationally for 
their gospel music for the 
last eight years, will be in 
concert at the First 
Assembly of God Church, 
\pril 10. Scheduled for 
7:30 p.m.. the concert is 
five and everyone is 
invited.

loci Perales has sung, 
played the piano and writ­
ten most of the material for 
The Gallileans out of 
Dallas During the time he 
lias appeared on the PTL 
Club. The Gospel Singing 
JUBILEE, and various 
other telecasts. The songs, 
"Born Again Children.” 
ami "I'm  on Tour", have 
been Joel's greatest hits. 
Currently he has one on 
the Singing News Charts. 
"H e's Coming Back 
Again". Being a licensed 
minister, he ministers both 
in song and word.

Rose Perales, is Joel's 
wife. She has been in the ' 
ministry along with her 
husband for nine years. 
Between 1974 and 1975. 
she was the only female 
vocalist THE GALILEANS 
have ever had. Recently 
she has given birth to the 
only bain boy__in the

Lulalysc is a new pro­
staglandin which is used to 
synchronize cstrus in cat­
tle. It saves time, labor and 
facilities involved in an A1 
breeding program.

Representatives from 
Upjohn Company. pro­
ducers of Lulalysc. as well 
as local Veterinarians 
Gleason and Cowart and 
County Extension Agents 
will be on hand at the 
program.
Coni. Page 7. Col. 8

City Council 
Meeting Agenda

Topics for (he City Co­
uncil Regular Meeting. A- 
pril 7. at 8:30 a.m. in City 
Hall include: City Council 
canvass and declaration of 
the results of the election 
held April 4. 1981. Swear­
ing in of new Council 
members.

Also. Dave Marr will ask
the'Council's permission to 
seek bids on the demolition 
or the 50.000 gallon fl­
eer head storage tank.

‘The Community Where 
Water Makes the Dif­
ference' slogan may be­
come a thing of the past if 
this ravage of our water is 
allowed to continue, said 
Mrs. June Saylor, local 
WIFE Chapter president.

With the possible deple­
tion of Bailey County water 
Mrs. Saylor and Mrs. 
Morris Killough. Publicity 
Chairman, met with the 
Commissioner’s Court on 
Thursday. April 2 to ex­
press the organization’s 
concern.

The WIFE organization 
requested the cooperation 
of the court in co-sponsor­
ing a county-wide meeting 
on this topic to be held in 
the Civic Center on April 
13 at 8 p.m. It is Mrs. 
Saylor's contention that 
"Lubbock is mining Bailey 
County water and we urge 
all county residents to join 
in a eoordinaled effort to 
understand and attempt to 
eombai the loss of our 
water."

Wavne Wyatt, manager 
of the High Plains Under­
ground Water Conserva­

tion District will be on 
hand to discuss the water 
resources and present facts 
that lie has available.

Mrs. Saylor expressed 
an expectation of repre­
sentatives of several large 
farm-related organizations 
as well as attorneys to be 
present at this meeting.

Bailey County Judge 
Glen Williams indicated 
Friday that the "Commis­
sioner's Court will sponsor 
Coni. Page h. Col. I

Blood Drive 
Wednesday

A blood drive has 
been set for Wednes­
day. April 8 from 2:00 
to 5:00 p.m. at the 
West Plains Medical 
Center. Blood donors 
are asked to come 
through the emergency 
entrance. Donors must 
be 17 years of age and 
weigh at least 110 
|x*unds. They must not 
currently be on medica­
tion or have a history or 
hepatitis.

j  />
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NINTH GRADE TRACKSTERS..... The ninth grade track team which will compete in the
Dimmitl Track Meet this weekend include: back row (L-R) Danny Mata, Hector Garcia, 
Preston Langford. Trent Hysinger. Tommy Carlson. Reynaldo Martinez, Milton Norman, 
and Coach Roger Morris. Members kneeling (L-R) are Danny Mendoza, Thurman Coleman, 
Perry Whalin, Jesse Navejar. Cheyenne Bickel. Dennis Ruthardt and Jim Holmes.

OSH A T o Review 
Cotton Dust Rule

The Labor Department's 
Occupational Safely and 
Health Administration 
(OSHA) has announced it 
will review its standard 
governing worker exposure 
to cotton dust to analyze 
the costs and benefits of 
the rule.

The agency will use its 
reexamination of this par­
ticular standard to explore 
the usefulness of cost- 
benefit analysis in setting 
worker health regulations 
generally.

Assistant Secretary of 
l abor Thorne G. Auehtcr. 
who heads OSH A. said

President Reagan February 
I7, which requires federal 
agamies to asses the costs 
and benefits of major reg­
ulations.

"Cost-benefit analysis is 
an important tool in pro­
ducing efficient regu­
lation." said Auehtcr. “ It 
is a way to make sure we 
choose the regulatory al­
ternative that offers society 
the greatest net benefit. 
Decisions based on balan­
cing of costs and benefits 
are made by everyone, 
everyday. Workers decide 
what job opport unities to 
accept, employers decide

much they arc willing to 
pay for the products they
want.

"Some type of cost- 
benefit analysis is implicit 
in all public health policy 
decisions as well." he con­
tinued. "Each time we as a 
nation say we arc willing to 
spend a fixed sum of 
dollars to prevent an es­
timated number of injuries, 
illnesses, or deaths we 
have determined that the 
benefits are worth the ex­
pense. I believe a cost- 
benefit analysis can help 
us as federal regulators do 
our jobs more effectively.
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W7/0.....Children at the Goodwill Center had a costume party Thursday at the center. Can you identify the 
m" I T '  Cr ttr  haS bCC" functionin8 since 1950, and is sponsored by the Souther Baptist Church in

11 1 un  ° ur an<1 ^ ve recc'vc kindergarten training. The Goodwill Center building was donated about
1970 by Kenneth Procure.

* * * *
In homesewing, always 

read the pattern guide- 
sheet from beginning to 
end before laying out the 
pattern on the fabric, cau­
tions Becky Saunders, 
clothing specialist.

Mrs. Saunders is on the 
home economics staff of 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service. The Texas 
A&M University System.

Bailey Counts Journal
Mtshed March Jl. l9t»J Published he Muksbof Publishing ( Iik Fvm Sundis at MM W Sonnet Bru 440 Muk-xhor lens >34" Second class Postage paid at Mulixh.ir Itsjv NJ4'
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Outside of Texas $12 953carls b\ ( art' r 1 $ 1 1 5 0
Monthly bs Car.-icr $95
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There are any number 
of people who will do 
great things if they can do 
them without exertion.

What with corn on the 
cob, watermelons and 
peaches coming along, 
this life isn't so bad.

Hot weather enthusi­
asts should have no com­
plaints left about the be­
ginning of summer, 1980.

Carnival & Bali

St. Clctin ’t

lie
_  parCiS

c ° " e5 c tieCl<0cp

G * ” 6 ? NO Pcf s s a 'V
i

IT COULD BE 
A BIG DEAL 
FOR YOU!

Each o f these advertised  item s is requ ired  to  be read ily  ava ilab le  lo r sale at or be low  the advertised  p rice  in each sto re , except 
as sp ec ifica lly  noted  in th is  ad We reserve the righ t to lim it quan tities  None so ld  to  dea le rs

Ground M ,  -  09 © =
Not Less Than 7 0 %  le a n  ■
3 lbs. or Over ^

« 4 '4» PA' ' W * ^ '

Chuck Blade Cut

u l l U U l  A

Roast \1 19 7-Bone ^  
Itoasl m 38

Q  Center Cut Beef Chuck

Steak $1 49
Smoked W ater A dded 

Whole or Half 
or Butt Portion

Hams . M M

Shuriine Flour
5 lb. bag

2 1 lb. pkgs.

, 69H

Kraft Parkay 9 Q  0
Shurfine Corn
Whole Kernel or Cream Style

17 oz. 3 cans 1
Shurfresh Eggs

Medium

mWk H
' - m m t $2

10 lb. bag

09 Potatoes
A ll Purpose Russel

Oranqesn $1
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.ourthouse
N ew s

WARRANTY DEEDS
George C. Gross and 

wife. Lucille Gross to H.J.

West Plains 
Medical Center | 

Report
> * * * > • *  O A A

ADMITTED 
March 30. Ruby Wilson. 
Ina Bieler. Benny Marli­
ne/. Isabelle Leal 
March .11. Sandy Gon/ales 
April I. Maria Cigarroa. 
Geraldine Meeks. W. F. 
Hopcr

DISMISSED
March 30. Pearl Gon/ales. 
G.L. Adrian. David Mc- 
Vickcr
March 31, Yolanda Vas- 
quc/. Ruby Hodge. Olenc 
Walls
April I. Deon Hum and 
baby girl. Isabelle Leal, 
Pearl Killingsworlh. Sandy 
Gon/ales. Keith Fuller 
April 2. Gloria Perez. An­
drea Jaramillo

leal—All of Loi Number 
(3). in Block Number (9). 
Warren Addition Number 
(I). to the Town of Mule- 
slme. Bailey County. Tx.

Joe Smith and wife. Ella 
Corienc Smith to Chris A. 
Mealy—All of Labor 14. 
League 123 Childress
County Schoyl Land. Bailey 
County. Texas.

Preston E. Cargilc and 
wife. Charlene Cargilc to 
Howard I. Watson and 
wife, Julia A. Watson—A 
5.0 Acre Tract of Land out 
ol the (SF.1/4) of Section 
(42). Block Y. WD and FW 
Johnson Subdivision of
State Capitol Land. Bailey 
County. Texas.

Margarita S. Lope/. 
Emma S. Gutierrez. Frank 
M. Saldana. Jr.. Espcranza 
S. Laredo. Jesusa S. Soto. 
Gloria S. Gu/man, Dolores 
S. Sala/er. Ermalinda M. 
Saldana and Diana M. 
Saldana to Marveling Mor­
eno Saldano— All of the 
(E'ly 45'). of Lots Numbers 
(22). (23). and (24). in 
Block Number (16). Origi­
nal Town of Mulcshoc. 
Bailey County. Texas.

Donald T. Mav and wife.

Littlefield Medical Center
Is Offering

f  or Part Time Or Full Time 
UN'S & LVIV'S

..... Mileage Allowance Paid Monthly..........
........... Generous Shift Differential.............
..................New Salary S eale .......................
...New Hospital With Modern Equipment...
.........Small Hospital With Inform al............
............... Working Environment..................

.............Tuition Reimbursed For
............... Continuing Education.................

( all Or Write Pat Hornung RI\\ 
Dir. Of Nursing, 

Littlefield Medical Center 
1500S. Sunset 

Littlefield, Texas 
806-385-6411 Ext. 308

Mildred V. May to Daniel 
S. M ay-Lots Numbers (5) 
and (6). Block Number (I). 
West Blocker Street, Prog­
ress. Bailey CouiilyLTcxas.

Glcna Gregory to Don 
Locker and wife. Donna 
Locker, and Fred W. Loc­
ker and wife. Ruth Lockcr- 
Thc (N/2) of the (NW/4) of 
Section (51). Block Y, WD 
and FW Johnson Subdivi­
sion. Bailey County. Texas.

T.H. Clem and wife. 
Ncoma Clem to W.R. Car­
ter and wife. Myrtle Carter

All of Labor Number 
(22). In League Number 
( l78). Motley County 
School Lands in Bailey 
County. Texas.

Doyle Eubanks and wife. 
Barbara Ann Eubanks to 
George Nicman and wife, 
Dianne Nicman—All of 
Lots (2). (3). and (4). Block 
S. Country Club Addition

Mac Far land 
Services Held 
In Llano

Funeral services for 
Roy L. MacFarland. 69. of 
Llano. Texas were held at 2 
pin . Thursday at the 
Methodist Church in Llano.

Masonic graveside ser­
vices were conducted at 
the Robert Lee Cemetery. 
MacFarland died March 31 
at the Brook Army Hospital 
in San Antonio.

He was born January 23. 
1912 in Winters. Texas. He 
graduated from high school 
at Robert Lee and was a 
retired Air Force Staff Sgl. 
serving in World War II as 
an aerial photographer. He 
was a past Grand Master 
of the Masonic Lodge in 
Slough Bucks. England 
w here he lived for approx­
imated 20 years.

Survivors include his 
wile. Marv; one son. 
Robert of Slough Bucks. 
England; one sister. Mrs. 
Bernis (Anne) Camp of 
Vfuk'slm c: one b ro ther.
Pearce MacFarland of 
Ponehaiotira. Louisiana: 
four step grandchildren 
and nine grandchildren.

to the City of Mulcshoc, 
Bailee County, Texas.

NOW WE’VE GOT THE 
SAVINGS EDGE FOR 
YOU ON IH COMBINES
There's no question whether this is 
the year to trade combines Because 
the Anniversary Savings deals 
we re making will have you 
trading tomorrow  

Check out your savings options... 
Red Edge Rebates. Red Power Dollars 
or Waiver of Finance. Each choice 
gives you the option to get the equip­
ment you need today at great savings 

Get a check directly from IH with a 
Red Edge Rebate. Just buy any new. 
self-propelled Axial-Flow Combine we

1

RED POWER DOLLARS
Model March April
1480. 1470. 
1460.1440 
1420

$5,450
$3,240

$4,935
$2,725

Waiver of Finance is also available
instead of Red Edge Rebate or Red 
Power Dollars. To qualify, just finance 
through International Harvester Credit 
Corporation for a specified minimum  
number of months and you'll pay no 
interest until product use season 
See us for complete details.

have in stock before April 30.1981 and 
a Red Edge Rebate check will be on its 
way to you. And the sooner you buy, 
the more you save

RED EDGE REBATE

W A ,OF. %

Model March April
1480. 1470. 
1460. 1440 
1420

$4,200
$2,500

$3,800
$2,100

Or instead of a rebate, you can take 
advantage of Red Power Dollars, that 
are good toward the purchase of any 
new IH equipment or parts

So if you need the 208 bushel 
capacity of the 1480. or if you've been 
waiting on the 125 bushel capacity 
1420, we re ready to put the Red 
Edge to work in your fields and the 
IH Savings Edge to work on your 
bottom line

Stop by today for your best product 
selection and best savings selection.
We even have great Red Edge Rebates 
and Red Power Dollars on our new, 
in-stock IH Tractors and selected Hay 
and Forage Equipment

The hard work of some 
people often explains 
their success.

c^ fd x ia n

^ P fic to y ta fif ty
2 1 8  q u .  2nd

^ U u fe lto c , rJfiMlS

/
For Easter

218 TU 2nd Qitand Opening Continues

272-3487 Family Portraits Done In 
The Home Or Studio 

Purchase One 16x20
Kecieve T wo 8x 10 Cuntom 

Color P o rtra it At No 
Additional Charge

DONA TION TO LIBRARY.....The Lester Howards donated 
a flag, through the Friends of the Library, to the Mulcshoc 
Public Library recently. Texas Public Library Week will be 
April 5-11. Pictured from left; Orpha Pecina. a HECE 
student employed at the library; Anne Camp, librarian; 
and Linda Lope/, an employee of the library.

Save $62°°

I Kodak paper... 
fora goodlook.

321 MAIN STREET 
MULESH0E

OPEN 9 to 6

A  N  T  H  O  N Y  C O .

BOSS IS GONE
'BOSS" IS GONE THIS WEEK 
AND THE EMPLOYEES ARE 
HAVING A PRE-EASTER SALE 
WHILE HE'S AWAY COME AND  
SEE THE SAVINGS DURING THE 

BOSS IS GONE SALE"/ /r

SALE GOOD MONDAY THRU SATURDAY ONLY!
Entire Stock

JUNIOR HANG TEN 
SPORTSWEAR

Pants, Shorts, Tops, Jackets...

Layaway Now 

SWIMWEAR

\

OFF

2 0  OFF

*

Junior
ATBJEANS

‘ 1 6 .
Entire Stock 

LADIES&JUNIORS
\

SKIRTS & DRESSES
o n %

OFF

G reat Selection

FAMOUS MAKER G0SSARD 
LINGERIE & SLEEPWEAR

Special Purchase Q  C  %
Just Arrived ^ 3  ^ F F

SAMSONITE AND
AMERICAN T0URIST0R  

LUGGAGE

Entire Stock V t  TO V l  OFF

ALL SHEER 
PANTYHOSE PR.

LADIES EASTER SHOE SALE
Group $788  Group $988 Group $ 1 2 88

_  , - . .
Assorted Styles
Choose from our 
G reat Selection

Wooley International Inc.

Two Pocket *  r.

MENS DRESS SHIRTS........... . 4  V
Short Sleeve <t“7 QQ
WESTERN SHIRTS......... ............... * 7
Miller Brand 0

WESTERN SHIRTS ..... * 1 2 88 ‘ 25 w .

MENS TIES $397
Anthony s ^ -  ^n qq  o r

DRESS SLACKS................. * . 1 2 88 $25
Navy, Brown, Gray
MEN'S HAGGAR $ -7-7
2 Pc. SUITS...................................V  /
Mens
LEVI ACTION
SLACKS........................................2 .1 7 88
Plain Label* Reg. *15.
MENS DENIM t r , 07 "

JEANS....................................,5. y 97

EASTER IS TWO WEEKS AWAY!
Cotton & Poly/Cotton
4 5 "  BOLTED PRINTS

Great For $ 1 11 ,
Easter Sewing! ‘ y d

UPHOLSTERY FABRICS
Herculons Velvets

Reg. $ 1 9 7  Reg. $ ^ 9 7

V i
f t

<r, ! j "Your Choice"

f - , h  GIRLS SHORT
'  M  Entire SETS

2 0 o/?>i

tr

INTERNATIONAL
AGRICULTURAL

W.Hwy 81 
272-5514

M EN'S DRESS SHOES

Entire 
\  Stock
'  2-14

Boys

SUITS & DRESS CLOTHES i
o n %

OFF

/ i i  Entire Stock

GIRLS EASTER DRESSESi
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J U N E  W E D D IN G  P L A N N E D ..... Mr. and Mrs. Bill Wall
would like to announce the engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter. Tammy, to Lee Elder, son of 
James Elder and Ruth Wimberly. The couple plan to be 
married June 12.

Sherrie Seaton 

Participates In 

All-Star Game
Sherrie Seaton recently 

participated in the Golden 
Spread All - Star game 
played on March 28 at 
Amarillo. She represented 
the West Team and was 
sponsored by Sherley-An- 
derson Elevators of Laz- 
buddic.

She was also chosen to 
the All-District and All 
South Plains team. She is a 
17 year old senior at Laz- 
buddic High School. She is

the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmie Dale Seaton 
of Lazbuddic and Kay Sea­
ton of Muleshoc.

* * * * *

Cotton sweaters will be 
strong fashion items for 
sprin '81. says Ann Van- 
derpoorlcn. a clothing spe­
cialist.

They arc versatile and 
come in a wide range of 
bright and pastel colors, 
she adds.

Ms. Vandcrpooilen is 
part of the home economics 
stafl of the Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service. 
The Texas A&M University 
Svstem.

c $ o w e / t s  Q l iu q u e
904CU/.6tk

dirt «s ieilp pfcm you* mddbd
'M lv do bmtifaQ sififc 

amnqpmuk: {p* a$ tmtsions.

THE EXERCISE DILEMMA
There is a new solution to the problem 
of reasonable, yet adequate exercise 

for people o f all ages! Something 
convenient that can be used in the 
privacy o f your own home. It makes 
monotonous exercise become a fun 

and invigorating attraction to belter 
health.
The solution is here and now,

“SUNDANCERS THE ANSWER"
(zfo/t n̂famatiofi CoM

272-3839 on 272-3402

Hobby Club
The Muleshoc Hobby 

Club met Thursday. April 2 
in the community room of 
Muleshoc Stale Bank. Riilh 
Bass presided over the 
business meeting. Fiddle 
Shafer was the hostess and 
Vela Self drew the hostess 
gift.

Items on display were 
crochet Easier eggs, doll 
with crochet blanket, 
needle point mail box. pin 
cushion, clown doll, lobster 
weight, picture of a great 
grandchild, covered shoe 
with flower arrangements, 
purse, foil covered bottle, 
rub out mushroom picture, 
pottery dish, pin wheel 
quilt, block quill top and 
clip yarn pillow.

#. •'

SHERRIE SEATON

NewPTA 
Officers To

Be Installed
On Monday. April 13 at 

3:45. the PTA will be in­
stalling the new officers 
and chairmen. The meet­
ing will be at the Mary 
DeSha/.o cafeteria. The ex­
ecutive meeting will be at 
3:45.

The new officers arc: 
President Robin Neptune, 

Prcsid i^.D pris 
I’.ihmv. 3rd Vu-f- Pve.sideHi
Debbie Noble. •Sfxbvtary 
Elaine Stout, Treasurer 
Kirma McQuirc. Historian 
Barbara Bush, and Parlia­
mentarian Maggie Ann 
Reynolds.

flic new chairmen arc 
S rupbook. Mrs. Karen 
Kidd. Grade Representa­
tive Mrs. Linda Tanksley. 
Membership, Shirley Rey­
nolds. Life Membership. 
Mrs. Jack Obenhaus. Leg­
islative. Mrs. .lolccn Cos­

ot. Hospitality. Mrs. 
Debra Wolfe. Publicity 
Mrs Betty Bush.

\fter the installation 
here will be new business 

p-oi.lining to next year, 
md refreshments will be 
- rved. There will be 
babysitters available.

Pacific® Sheet Sets
Pacific Mfe1® sheet sets are a beautiful way to save! Their “Canadian Sunset" 
pattern is a strikng pattern of earthtone colors. Each set contains 1 flat 
sheet, 1 fitted sheet, and 2 ptowcases (twin set has1 pjHowcase). Qther 
patterns available (not n al stores): 'les Fleurs, “Oriental Spring , and 

Plaid".

Tw in  ,
Full 1497 
Queen 1897
King 2397 I  i l l  r t  a

1 *1  fill Ml to I 'l l  rt: t
i, «  a t *  « * ! • * : $
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Members present were 
Ruth Bass. Mable Cald­
well. Edith Fox. Opal Rob­
inson. Gurtic Kirk, Allic 
Barber. Joe Wilson, Ola 
Epperly. Verna Dement. 
Vickie Henderson, Sammic 
Ethridge. May Lloyd. Fid­
dle Shafer. Myrtle Cliarn- 
blcss. Bill Phillips. Hallic 
Briscoe. Vela Self, and 
Verniee Amerson.

The next meeting will be 
April 15 with Allic Barber 
as hostess.

^eted  QAAtli 

QtidaC Shorn
Mrs. Kenneth Harris 

was feted with a bridal 
shower Saturday. March 28 
from 10:00-11:30 a.m. in 
the Friendship Room of the 
Ifilh and Avc. D Church of 
Christ.

Nela Templar, sister of
the bride, registered the
guests. Assorted breads.
cider and coffee were
served from silver and
crystal appointments.

The serving table was
covered with a while lace
cloth and enhanced with an
arrangement of cut flowers
in the bride's chosen colors
of blue and white.

The hostesses presented
the honoree a corsage of
blue carnations and a
vacuum cleaner * * * *

Conversationalist: One 
who appreciates tht 
sound of his or her voice.

Diabetic Meeting 
Scheduled 

For April 13
"Oil A Clear Day. Ynu 

Can See Forever?" will be 
the subject of the next 
regular meeting of the

WOTS
Weekly Meeting

I he Women of folk Sta­
tion (WOTS) met Thursday 
\pril 2. in the community 
i mill of Tri County Sav ings 
and Loan for their weekly 
get together and covered 
ili-Ji luncheon. Hostesses 
»v re Jeri Chapman and 
/  lima Toler.

Members present were 
Hilda Wright of Earth. 
Helen Williams. Mildred 
Williams. Donna Thornp- 
viii. Jerri Chapman and 
I i ki. Zellma Toler. Nora 
Elanary. I.ois Mariincc. 
Del,iris Gibbons. Mary 
\nn Ramirez. Kay Madry. 
Millie Mitchell. Jo Ann 
Elm an. Aim and Sean. 
I i.e Wellborn. Betty Bar- 
k • Doris Fighimasier. 
Eva Cruz and Donnila 

>w tier.
Guests present were 

Connie seliweriner of Far- 
v-II Wanda Harman and 
I >die Tennyson of Sudan.

l or more information on 
'i W() f S group, you may 

Mildred Williams at 
s?b() or I.ois Mariincc 

. 3019.

Greater Lubbock Chapter 
of the American Diabetes 
Association. Our guest
speaker will be Susan
Broome, a diabetic telling 
her personal story stres­
sing eye problems.

This meeting is
scheduled for April 13 at 
7:30 p.m. in room 5AI00 of 
the Texas Tech University 
Health Sciences Center.

Free literature on diet 
and related health care for 
the diabetic will be avail­
able at this meeting.

Anyone wishing to learn 
more about diabetes is 
invited to attend.

<

Jogger
Safety
Studied

While jogging has be­
come the favorite pastime 
of many Americans, jog­
gers expose themselves to 
various risk factors, says a 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service safely engi­
neer.

A study by the Insurance 
Institute for Highway 
Safety shows that only a 
small proportion of more

than 8.000 
deaths and tens 
sands of injuries! 
joggers, says T 
Nelson. And the 
ports that the healtl 
His of running m  
the danger of beinj 
a motor vehicle.

However, risk fac 
exist that increase tl 
lihood of being hit| 
motor vehicle whil  ̂
ging. says Nelson, 
include jogging after 
jogging with other 
or jogging on roadsl 
the flow of traffic;.

Announcing . .

Rhonda Kitchens 
is now associated with 

the HoneyComb.
I

Rhonda invites all her 
customers & friends to call 

her. She specializes in 
Blow-drying & Perms.

Rhonda Kitchens

Call Money, Jake, Tammy, or Rhonda today for an appointment.

272-5.08 ^ o n e y  C o m b  120Ave.c

COtl

< • *
Privacy is the rule

Nancy Hutchins knows babies can bring a 
little something unexpected into your life: 
extra pounds. W sight that's tough to get rid 
of when you're busy caring for children—  
cooking fo i them, nibbling at the food they 
don't finish By the time she'd hcid two 
babies, her weight to d  really become a 
problem Shewasupto 151 pounds, more 
than her 5 '6 "  frame could handle

'M y husband was too kind to say anything 
outright,' Nancy says, 'but he started drop­
ping quiet hints like, 'You don't really need to 
eat that, do yo u ? '

Although she realized she hod to do 
something soon, she wasn't sure whcit 
When she heard about Pert Walker's from a  
friend, she was skeptical.

Could it possibly work for tier7

The easy way to exercise
Nancy discovered that Pat Walker's iSik it a 
put-on-youf-leotard-and-let's-exercisp 
place Pat Walker's exclusive passive exei - 
Ciseumt, called Symmeti k on, requires only 
that you lie back and let it do the wexk As it
tones, tightens, and smoothes ynui Iv tly . 
you have the sensation of a genii' •, pk-osont 
workout.

Privacy is the rule
Nancy especially liked the privacy of Pat 
Walker's Because you don't work up a 
sweat, street clothes are perfectly comfort­
able and suitable So you don't have to wear 
a leotard, or reveal your figure flaws to a 
roomful of other women. From your consul­
tations about sensible eating habits with Pat 
Walker's professional counselors to your 
sessions on the passive exercise unit, every 
aspect of your reducing program is con­
ducted incomplete privacy. You're a special 
and valued patron at Pat Walker's, not a 
school g irl in a gym class.

Results tell the story
Before long, Nancy was a believer. "When I S  
began to notice how big the waistlines in my 
clothes were getting, I really got excited!
I started out a size 14, and now I'm a 7. And 
let me tell you, I |ust love buying new 
clothes M y husband doesn't even complain 
when I buy another new dress— he likes 
me so much!"

Now thirty-eight pounds and 52 V i inches 
(total) smaller than she was, Nancy Hutchins 
is delighted with her new look. You'll like 
yours, too.

Free figure analysis
The best way to find out what Pat Walker's 
can mean to you is to make an appointment 
lo r o free, no-obligation consultation cit a Pat 
Walker's salon. W e'll tell you in detail about 
tlm entire program . . how much you can 
lose, how long it w ill take, how much it w ill 
cost And w e ll treat you to a session on the 
Symmetricon unit, so you can see how 
relaxing it is.

Comeon. C allus As Nancy Hutchins 
says, "If Pat W alkei 'scan do it for me, they 
can do it for you!"

Save 25% on On Your Figure Correction 
Before April 15th
Treatment Mow *4.®° ^  Effective April ffrth

.e c S ****
PerV c "00
o f '01'ce"

272-4591 
119 Ave C Muleshoe, 

Hours: 8 a.m.- 8 p.m.
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MR AND MRS. DENNIS NOVOSAD |nee Pam Davenport]

The TOPS Club met at 
6:30 p.m., Thursday. April 
2 in the meeting room of 
Bailey County Electric. 
Clara Lou Jones, leader, 
called the meeting to 
order. The TOPS pledge 
was recited and the fel­
lowship song sung.

Linda Vinson read the 
minutes of the previous 
meeting. Roll call was by 
Evclcne Harris, weight re­
corder. Clara Lou named 
the appointed officers for 
1981. They arc Evelene 
Harris and Jeri Serna, 
weight recorders; photog­
rapher. Millie Mitchell; 
scrap book, Mary Ann Ra-

mcriz; flower and card girl. 
Ruth Clements; reporter, 
Thcrsia Davis; hostess. 
Jewell Peeler; contest. 
Clara Crain.

Belinda Lopez was best 
loser for the week. Leavell 
Parker Vas first runner up 
and second runner up was 
Libby Black.

Best loser for the month 
was Mary -AninsRameri/. 
first runnet tfp wax Zeffa 
Shafer. Josie Pedroza was 
second runner up. Mildred 
Mitchell was crowned 
KOPS monthly queen. 
Dcllis DeLoach received a 
pin for being a KOPS 10 
years.

A new contest will begin 
next week and will con­
tinue six weeks. The one to 
lose the most weight will 
receive a gift from the 
club.

Cleta Robertson celebra­

ted her birthday. The 
meeting was dismissed 
with the singing of the 
goodnight song.

Ripe Olive-Spinach 
Chowder

1 package (10 ounces)
frozen chopped 
spinach

2 tablespoons butter
or margarine 

2 cups milk 
2' tablespoons flour 
1 owp-ra ruled cMek en - 

broth
1/2 teaspoon salt

1 /8 teaspoon ground 
nutmeg

Dash of pepper 
1 cup pitted California 

ripe olives, sliced
Thaw spinach in medium- 

size saucepan in butter or 
margarine; simmer, covered, 
4 to 5 minutes, or until spin­
ach is tender. Blend together 
milk and flour; add to spinach 
along with chicken broth and 
seasoning^. Cook over medium 
heat, stirring constantly, until 
soup thickens slightly. Add 
olives and simmer 1 minute; 
add additional salt, if desired. 
Serve hot with croutons. 
Makes 4 servings.

Guess Who Is

A

Miss Pamela Suzanne 
Davenport and Dennis 
Novasad were united in 
marriage Saturday. March 
14 at 2 p.m. at St. John’s 
Lutheran Church in Lariat. 
Pastor Herman Schclter 
read the double ring vows.

Parents of the couple arc 
Mr. and Mrs. Calvin 
Meissner of Muleshoe, 
Marvin Davenport of 
Ncedmorc and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Novasad of 
Nocdvillc. Texas.

Matching spiral candcl- 
abras with pink candles, 
baby’s breath and 
greenery flanked the altar. 
Also matching basket ar­
rangements of while stock, 
dusty pink carnations and 
burgandy mums with 
baby’s breath. Burgandy 
candles decorated with 
hurrican globes and flow­
ers matching the basket 
decor were placed in the 
windows.

The unity candle was 
decorated the same with 
taper candles, that the 
mothers lit upon entering 
1 Ite church. The bride and 
groom look the lighted 
tapers and lit the candle 
before leaving the church.

Miss Davenport was es­
corted by Calvin Meissner 
and given in marriage by 
Mr. and Mrs. Calvin 
Meissner, parents of the 
bride. She wore a formal 
length gown of while or­
ganza fashioned with a 
high neckline and full 
length split bishop sleeves.

The empire bodice had a 
cameo inserted in a see- 
through yoke, dusted with

i . c . q M g

Cefeb/t a te

80t(i ^iAthday '
J.C. Wells was honored 

with a birthday dinner 
Sunday. March 22, in the 
home of his daughter. Mr. 
and Mrs. Claude Patton of 
Lubbock. He was celebrat­
ing his 80th birthday.

Wells was born March 
20. 1901 near Mcxia, Texas 
and moved to Lubbock 
County in 1922. He and his 
family moved to Bailey 
County near Circle Back in 
1932. where he farmed. He 
also farmed west of Mule- 
shoe before retiring 
years ago. He moved 
Sudan in 1975.

Those present at the 
celebration included his 
wife. Myrtle Wells; Mrs. 
Mary Williford. Rita and 
Rose of Abernathy: Lori 
Patton and Mr. and Mrs. 
Arlan Patton and Alan of 
Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Wells of Amarillo; 
Kenneth Wells. Jeff and 
Chris of Hobbs; Mr. and 
Mrs. Glenn Chester and 
John, Mrs. Shcllyc Chester 
Chad and Josh, and Mr. 
and Mrs.Wayne Doty and 
Carpiec Johnson, all of 
Sudan.

A daughter. Linda Wells 
of Denver. Colorado, called 
to wish Wells a "Happy 
Birthday."

18
to

If Not N.O.W. 
When?

If you haven't yet com bined your savings and checking  
accounts into a Muleshoe State Bank N .O .W . Account, 
you’re losing in terest—fast!! The N .O .W . Account acts 
like a regular checking account— there when you need it. 
Open a N .O .W . A ccount— now and watch your interest 
grow!!

1 M U L E S H O E ]  
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tiny pearls and silk em­
broidery. The a-linc skirl 
flowed into a Cathedral 
train. A full laec panel 
formed the hem line of (he 
skirl and train.

Her headpiece was a 
derby hat of Chantilly lace 
trimmed with silk roses 
and draped French veiling, 
which cascaded down the 
back.

She carried a bouquet of 
silk lillics. daisies, camel- 
ins and dahlias in pink and 
burgandy with baby’s 
breath and silk ribbon 
streamers that tied her 
aunt’s Bible into the bou­
quet.

In keeping with tradition 
something new was her 
dress and hat; something 
old was the pennies dated 
in the bride and groom’s 
birthdays: something bor­
rowed was a white satin 
Bible belonging to the 
bride’s aunt. Mary Hanna; 
something blue was her 
mother’s blue garter.

The rnaic of honor was 
Johanna "J..I ."  Jordan of 
Lubbock. Bridesmaids 
were Gwen Neeley of Lub­
bock and Debbie Parmer of 
Muleshoe. The attendants 
wore burgandy stain sheen

J.C. WELLS

polyester formals with 
blouson blouse with a 
scooped ruffled neckline. 
Their flower headpiece and 
matching bouquets were 
made of the same flowers 
as the bride’s except made 
into nosegays. The maid of 
honor's bouquet was a 
smaller version of the 
bride's wiih more pink 
added.

Flower girl was Misty 
Davenport, niece of the 
bride. She was dressed as 
a miniature bride and car­
ried a basket of silk 
flowers.

Best man was Todd 
Cly nch of Fort Worth. 
Groomsmen were Brock 
Bowers of Richmond and 
Mark Novasad of Nccd- 
ville. brother of the groom. 
The ring bearer was 
Darrel Novak, cousin of the 
groom of Houston.

Michael Davenport of 
Muleshoe. Marvin Daven­
port. Jr. of Houston, 
brothers of the bride, and 
Todd Novasad of Nced- 
villc. brother of the groom, 
were ushers.

The groom wore a char­
coal gray tails with vest 
and striped ascot. The 
groomsmen and bridal 
party wore gray matching 
tuxedoes with vests and 
striped a scots. The ring- 
bearer wore the same as 
the groomsmen.

For her daughter's wed­
ding. Mrs. Meissner wore 
a burgandy formal with a 
soft pleated skirt and chif­
fon bell sleeves and a 
corsage made in the 
bride's chosen colors. The 
groom’s mother wore a 
dusty mauve formal sun­
dress with a burgandy 
chiffon sash and long

sleeve chiffon three quar­
ter length jacket made of 
liny pleats with a wrist 
corsage in the bride's cho­
sen colors.

Out of town wedding 
guests were registered by 
Cara Bass, from Sudan. 
Ncedmorc. Morton. Lub­
bock. Littlefield. Anton, El 
Paso. Andrews. Ozona, 
Tarzan, Stafford. Need- 
ville. Richmond, Houston, 
Plainvicw and Clovis.

A reception was held in 
the Parish Hall following 
the ceremony. Members of 
the houscparly were Lisa. 
Kcllye and Lori Novasad. 
sisters of the groom, Liz. 
Kaltwasscr. Diane Skip- 
worth. Mildred. Donna and 
Vickie Hascloff. Donna and 
Mary Kalvas. Mary Alice 
Ramm. Terri Young. Cara 
Bass and Bea Campos.

For a wedding trip to 
Ruidosa the bride’s travel 
ensemble was a silk cream 
colored belted chemise 
with burgandy pin stripes 
and burgandy gibson girl 
bow. They will make their 
home in Lubbock, where

Annual Spring 
Fashion Show 
Thursday April 9

The Lazbuddie FHA and 
Young Homemakers are to 
be hosting their annual 
spring fashion show. The 
fashion show will be pre­
senting the fashions of 
1981 followed by a tasty 
tea. It will start at 7:00 
p.m. on Thursday. April 9 
at the Lazbuddie Cafeteria. 
Admission will be SI.50 for 
adults and $1.00 for chil­
dren under 12 years of age.

ilie bride and groom arc 
boll) employed with the 
Methodist Hospital as 
medical technologists and 
the grixmi is a pre-med 
student at Texas Tech.

The groom's parents 
hosted a rehearsal supper 
at Leal’s Restaurant March 
13 for the wedding party 
and out of town guests.

Smile

Create your own 
individual look 
with a private, 
professional, 

makeup 
application.

coming to our salon
la  Maur

professional 
makeup artist/ 
skin specialist

Sandra Davidson 

April 9,1981

your iwrsonalized 
appuntmen! witlndude
• ScwntitK vkm analyse with a $ diopter magnifying lamp • Deep pore dun < learning treatment • Re ptemshment ot tkm x natural mon lure balance • Evaluation ot facial structure and features • Makeup con volution Hiji reate vour own mdrvid ual took • Professional makeup

Main Street 
Beauty Salon

115 Main Muleahor

272-3443

.....
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has moved from  Hilltop Plaza to 420 Main St,! 

9  ha* combined with The Fashion Shop!

ha* expanded U p s t a i r s !

2 0 %off Storewide
........................  “  ’O ’P *

Register For Free Prizes!
/. Jone* ;\eir York Com/lose' (3 piece)
2. Jack R inter Com/Htse' (3 piece)
3. Calvin Klein Jeans
4. 'IO' Jeans
5. Condor Tailored Dress Slacks
6. LeMar lilonse

Drawing To He Held April 18!
-----------------------------

l Doe, not include ,/ietial ,ale grou/n'.t

Free, . .  Evan Picone Hose 
with every purchase 
o f950,00 or more!

Free . . . Every Purchase Receives A 
*20% Discount Slip From 

Bob's Mr. Shop!
Refreshments Served April 2nd, 3rd and 4th! 
Prices C,ottd Thru April 18. 1081!

r

Quality Is Always In Season At Lady You-Nique, ('heck Our Lines:
Se^nrnle* H ./\  Irn Joyce. S ichel. iluii 4hel. J o in ;  Sen )o rk Jeon« t uh in Klein, t urrnde'. 'It l\  HJA Swoon. Snchel

Queen Site I  oilmens, h u h  llyn Mur. Martini Mono mg < oonlinalen 1‘nifiheiy. John Meier. Jutlea Vll ) ork. h iye 's  lionet. 

Jack Sinter, t.len he tin Drone* llernuai Mnrrun, Metis,a h m c . Martha Manning. H nm h y  Ki/i/h’I. IKnne Io n  hirslenhurg. 

Lizsy unil Jo h n n y Skirl,  tru s s , Horne. In i Joyce. Wmim 1/  Mur. \ a  Mil. Steintrl h m g . A im  Ahell. hire ( nicker 

Panin t nlif Jam . t.oinlor. J P  Silver, liol/ili Driginnln. i.idilie, It.I.S. ^ ^ U g rw u e , 1 etuli. Juliana

Junior Swinsuils 
One Piere

JtinHen 
Nigh Tide 
Snnn/mx 
IhpfH-rs 
Let»» Meeni *1995

Missy Blouses
Large h r  on ft 
Size 6  To 16 
Heg $22  to $ 2 2 ........ *1595

Jeans
Benito Fashion* If* I bonk 
Heg $26  
Ms. Lee  I nrdtiros 
Heg. $2$
V hde. Haiti. Tnit/o- s1 6 9 5

Upstairs..
• Sharis

• Jeans
• Swimwear

• kn it Tops

• Novelty Tops 

* Junior Dresses

• Rom \ ter*

• Overalls

• Coveralls

M em b er FDIC 2 7 2 - 4 5 6 1

Hals • • • ho shorn B entrrn. fir**** Fodtitot* 

Purses • • • Sirtnr* n od  Ponlelt 

Prom Dresses . . • /ton /.tint, f ttndi June

420 Main Street 
Clorin. \ew  Mexico
11> I Mailer I  hurge 
) im - '«/»«• t halve  
tree Itle n iliim , ■ He a ill do D \ t .  
free a llrrn lioo l" 'r  gannenl mi any
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Muleshoe... Report.
Com. Frorti Page 1

Army Pvt. James Car­
rasco. son of Ida Carrasco 
of 709 Cleveland. Friona, 
Texas, recently completed 
the Duster Crewman 
course at the U.S. Army 
Air Defense School. Fort 
Bliss, Texas.

* * * * *
Army Pvt. Ernest Pineda 

Jr., son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernesto Pineda of Farwell. 
Texas, recently completed 
the Duster crewman 
course at the U.S. Army 
Air Defense School. Fort 
Bliss. Texas.

Effort.
Com. From Page 1 
and mail out invitations to 
each county tax payer to 
attend this proposed meet­
ing.'* The Judge further 
stated that, "the meeting 
is being held for the pur­
pose of discussing the pros 
and cons of the situation, 
voicing of concerns of 
county residents and to 
discuss possible action for 
curtailment of the loss of 
this water. If and when 
anything can be done it 
will have to be a united 
effort and one which will 
involve the whole of Bailey 
County."

Best Of Press
Can't

The old grouch can’t 
get enthusiastic about 
babies, because he knows 
they're going to grow up 
to be people.

-Globe, Boston.

Rising Costs
Many men would keep 

themselves in the best of 
spirits if prices were 
lower.

-Sun, Adak, Alaska.

There Are
There are three kinds 

of people: those who make 
things happen, those who 
watch things happen, and 
those who have no idea 
what happened.

-Wall Street Journal.

Com. From Page I 
benefits.

Housing. Occupants of 
federally subsidized rental 
housing have a limit of 25 
percent on the share of 
their incomes that can go 
for rent. But housing costs 
of four million homeowners 
and 10 million other ren­
ters arc more than 30 
percent of their incomes.

Public - Service Jobs. 
While this program was 
intended .to assist the 
hard-core unemployed, on­
ly 30 percent of those who 
enter it ever find a private- 
sector job. In 1969, 64 
indictments were returned 
in 15 cities for embezzle­
ment. kickbacks and bri­
bery in the handling of 
federal funds under the 
public-service category of 
the Comprehensive Em­
ployment and Training 
Act.

In addition, many com­
munities use CETA funds 
for routing municipal ser­
vices. rather than for 
training programs for the 
hard-core unemployed.

Federal Retirement. 
Pensions of retired federal 
workers are now raised 
twice a year to compensate 
for inflation. But the Gen­
eral Accounting Office has 
recommended a single an­
nual adjustment. noting 
that. "Fcdcra retirees are 
the only group we are 
aware of who receive un­
limited cost-of-living ad­
justments twice a year. 
This is highly inequitable 
to others not similiarly 
treated, is costly and 
should not be continued.”

The Chamber report also 
drew these conclusions a- 
bout Social Security pro­
grams:

Student Benefits. This 
program "duplicates other 
student-aid programs, 
based on need, that have 
increased from S284 mil­
lion in 196S t«f $7 bilfiofl in 
1981. Two thirds of recip­
ients of the student-benefit 
program would not qualify 
if need were (he basis for

BEFORE VOU TAKE 
ANOTHER DAY OF RISK, 

REMEMBER THIS...

I l l.

NO MATTER WHAT 
HAPPENS BETWEEN NOW 

AND HARVEST, 
WE'LL GUARANTEE YOUR 

YIELD AND PROTECT 
YOUR INCOME.

That’s the promise behind All-Risk 
Federal Crop Insurance.

What does it mean for you? Plenty.
Because by locking in a guaranteed yield 
and income, you cover the risk of losses 
from natural disasters such as drouth, 
flood, insects and disease.

How do you get All-Risk Federal 
Crop Insurance? Simple. Just apply for 
insurance with your nearest FCIC 
representative. Select the yield coverage 
level—up to 75% of your county average.
Then pick one of three price levels—up to 
90% of projected market price.

For more information, call the FCIC 
representative in your area. All-Risk 
Federal Crop Insurance. In good years 
and bad, it pays off.

All-Risk
Federal Crop Insurance

l-Harmi

obtaining payments.” 
Minimum Benefits. This 

plan was devised to assure 
low-income workers a re­
tirement benefit greater 
than the amount they
would be entitled to on the 
basis of their earnings. It 
has been widely used,
however, by fcdcra retirees 
to qualify for benefits in a 
relatively brief work period 
after leaving government 
service. The average fed­
eral retiree receiving aid 
under the program is al­
ready drawing $900 a 
month from a civil-service 
pension. Overall. 74 per­
cent of beneficiaries under 
this program do not de­
pend on it as a primary 
source of retirement in­
come. Ten percent have 
spouses earning $14,000 a 
year or more.

Disability Program. 
More than 500.000 indivi­
duals drawing benefits un­
der this program arc no 
longer disabled.

Concert •••
Com. Froni Pane I 
miracle baby. At birth, 
doctors found out she had 
a spinal infection called

Commissioners •••
Coni. From Page I

appointing Rudolph Moraw 
Commissioner of Precinct 
4. as negotiator for right- 
of-ways on the proposed 
FM Road 3397. south of 
Circleback. This is to be 
done in behalf of the Com­
missioner’s Court.

An order to employ 
Richard Collard. an attor­
ney from Friona. to handle 
legal aspects of obtaining 
the right-of-ways on FM 
3397.

A final order was passed 
for the proposed installa­
tion of a sign for Five Area 
Telephone Cooperative. 
Inc. This sign will be 
placed on the civic center 
properly.

spinal meningitis. But we 
dedicated her as she laid in 
an incubator in intensive 
care. God let us keep her 
and we have dedicated her 
to His service. She has four 
recordings to her name, 
even though she is only 
eight years old. Usually the 
climax of a service is when 
she does her sign language 
as a medley of praise 
choruses are sung.

I.inda Gonzales, is a tre­
mendous asset to the 
family. She is responsible 
lor Yvonne's sign language 
efforts, handles the office 
duties and when she gets 
behind the microphone, 
get ready for some fine 
singing.

Jay Acuna, is another 
minister in the group. He 
plays the bass guitar, sings 
and often gets a chance to 
minister as he shares his 
testimony with the people, 
lay played the bass guitar 
lor a group from Rich­
mond. Virginia called

■ H i l l  H 0  4 . I  H

Planting
We Have A Complete Line 

Of BulkGarden Seed,
Bermuda, Blue Grass & Perennial Rye 

For Your Lawns

Asgrow, Browning & Growers 
White Corn Seed

Ray Griffiths & Sons
North End O f  Main 272-4585

Keep I n Touch

With Muleshoe

And Surrounding

Area By Reading

Journal

TF.DDY HUFFAM AND
THE GF.MS.

The Greyhound bus that 
transports the family is 
getting very popular, as it 
is seen on the interstate 
constantly.... over 100.000

miles a year to be exact. 
Last year the family did 
over .300 dates, nationally
and internationally.

* * * *
Isn’t it funny how little 

value other people put on 
vour time?

George Bush, Vice Presi- v 
dent, on giving Atlan­
ta SI.5 million grant 
for investigation.
"Our feelings mirror 

the feelings of this coun­
try. I hope the federal 
assistance will end this 
traum a."

Cordovan
0 ^ 1 '■% A 1

X 2 0 0
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MAINTENANCE FREE

batteries
Group 24 Batteries

36 Months

E x tra  S p e c ia l
LOW
P r ic e

-ROUP

5D
7D
8 D

22F
24
24
24
24F
24F
27
27
27F
27F
29F
30H
3EH
3ET
4EH
4DLT
42
53
60
UIL

72

2 1
74
1 -8 V

2*8 V
4-8V

APPLICATION I  WARRANTY

IHC-GM-FORO 18 Mos.

PRICE 

26.44
IHC-GM-FORO 24 Mos. ^ 8 9

AC-CAT-IHC 
OLIVER TRACTORS 24 Mos. 41.79
CASE-IHC-MF
TRACTORS 24 Mos. T T T c T

MOST DKSU TRUCKS 24 Mos. T T S T
JD-MF-MM-OLIVER 
WHITE TRACTORS 24 Mos.

lO-fORO TRACTORS 24 Mos.
68.30
157T

M T . - M C  TRACTORS 24 Mos.
FORD-GM-CHRVSLER 36 Mos. T O T
CM AMC-DODCE- 
CHRYSI.ER 24 Mos. 3L35
CM AMC DODGE 
CHRYSLER 36 Mos. [ J
GM-AMC-DOOGF 60 Mos.
FORD MOTOR 36 Mos.

57.95
46.70

FORO MOTOR 60 Mos. T T 7 5 "

CM 36 Mos. 49.79
GM 60 Mos. 63.95
FORD MOTOR 36 Mos. 49.79
FORO MOTOR 60 Mos. 63.95
FORO MOTOR 36 Mos. 40.79
AC-CASE JD-IHC MASSEY 
MM TRACTORS 24 Mos.
JO-IHC TRACTORS 24 Mos.

68.10
“ 54.25

JO TRACTORS 24 Mos.
IHC TRACTORS 24 Mos.
FORO TRACTORS 24 Mos.

66.49
T U T

VOLKSWAGEN 36 Mos.

HPUSTMAl 36 Mos.
42.89
1 5 t T

GM 36 Mos. 44.85
Gvfen Tractor 12 Mos. 14 .30
GM 36 Mos. 40.35
SL 36 Mos. 54.95
CM 60 M ot. 61.95
Replaces 111PP 24 Mos. 35.85
Replaces OK (19. 

Depletes EV APP.

24 Mos. 7TST
24 Mos. T T E

A&M

Zrill.Jtlll

FARM &  RANCH 
SUPPLY
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OSHA...
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id see how regulatory costs 
and benefits can be 
weighed in an actual
ease."

Auehtcr stressed that 
ilie cotton dust standard, 
issued June 19. 1978.
should remain in effect 
during the accncy’s reas­
sessment of the issues.

“Cotton dust has long 
been recognized as a major 
indusliral health hazard." 
said Auehtcr. “ During the 
past year, employers have 
been required to institute 
most of the rule’s protec­
tive measures, including 
mandatory use of respira­
tors to control exposure. 
The provision that cotton 
dust be controlled solely by 
engineering and work 
practice methods is not 
scheduled to go into effect 
until 1984. This gives us 
time to investigate the 
practicality of weighing the 
standard’s costs and bene­
fits which were not con­
sidered during the original 
rulemaking and. if warran­
ted. make changes in the 
standard."

Auehtcr explained that 
past administrators of 
OSHA have maintained 
that the use of cost-benefit 
analysis would be incon­
sistent with the Occupa­
tional Safely and Health 
Act. " It 's  time to reex­
amine that traditional re­
sistance to cost-benefit 
analysis." said Auchter. 
"and to help us do that, we 
need current data."

Auehtcr said the agency 
is requesting comments on 
the extent to which cost- 
benefit analyses should be 
used in setting worker 
health standards, as well 
as information necessary to 
conduct a comprehensive 
analysis of the cotton dust 
standard and any regula­
tory alternatives. In partic­
ular. OSHA needs: com­
plete-estimates of the-rost- 
of compliancewith the cof-' 
ton dust rule; other pro­
posed means to protect 

1 exposed employees; and
financial information on 
the strength of the textile 
industry, its structure and 
capital needs.

The agency also will ac­
cept comments on the need 
to consider enforcement 
issues involving (he cur- 

( rent standard, such as
problems with the vertical 
clutriator and Class III 
electrical hazards in textile 
mills, discussed in an Oc­
tober 10. 1980 Federal 
Register notice; and dif­
ficulties in applying partial 
shift use of respirators as 
described in the Federal 
Register December 10, 
1980.

Comments should be 
submitted by May 15 to the 
Docket Offictr. OSHA. 
Docket No. H-052B. Room 
S02I2. Frances Perkins 
Labor Department Build­
ing. Third St. and Con- 

 ̂ slit ill ion Avc.. NW. Wash­
ington, D.C. 20210 (phone 
202 '522-7894).

I he OSHA cotton dust 
standard was challenged in 
a suit by industry and labor 
but was upheld October 24. 
I<)7<) bv the U.S. Circuit 
Court of Appeals for the 
District or Columbia. That 
decision was appealed to 
the U.S. Supreme Court 
which heard oral argu­
ments on the matter Jan. 
21. 1981. The Court has 
been asked to decide a- 
mong other issues, the role 
of cost-benefit analysis in 
setting toxic substance 
standards under the OSHA 
Act. Since OSHA itself 
plans to reconsider the role 
of cost-benefit analysis, the 
Solicitor General, on behalf 
"I the agency, is filing a 
motion with the Supreme 
Court on March 27 for 
leave to file for supple­
mentary memorandum on 
the agency’s decision to 
reopen the rulemaking re­
cord.

An advance notice of 
proposed rulemaking on 
the cotton dust standard 
which discusses the issues 
in more detail is scheduled 
to be published in the 
Federal Register March 21, 
1981.

MX...
Com. From Page 1
care and dinner will be
available.

A fact sheet has been 
prepared for the DEIS 
hearings and will available 
in quantities. The MX Ac­
tion Group would like to 
know how many will be 
coming and if someone 
from this area will be 
coming to pick up the fact 
sheets.

According to a story in

LOCAL FARMER HONORED..... The DeKalb Yieldmas-
ters Club honored 31 of the nations’s top corn producers at 
a national recognition meeting March 5 near St. Charles, 
Illinois. Billy Burrow (left) southern-western area sales 
manager for DeKalb, congratulates Mr. and Mrs. John 
Neil Agee of Mulcshoe. Agee produced an irrigated yield 
of 208.51 bushels per acre with DeKalb XL-72aa to win 
recognition from the organization.

Friday’s Lubbock
Avulunehe Journal, the 
Texas Senate passed a res­
olution Thursday asking 
Congress not to locate part 
of the MX missile system 
in Texas.

The Senate approved 
SCR 52. sponsored by 
Hereford Senator Bill Sar- 
palius by a vole of 22 to 4. 
Sarpalius said U.S. Rep. 
Kent Hance of Lubbock 
has agreed to read the 
resolution in Congress.

SCR 53 requests that 
Congress not adopt a split- 
basing mode for the MX 
missile system. Under the 
split-basing proposal, part 
of the system would be 
located in each of four

slates - lexas. New Mexi­
co. Utah and Nevada.

Defense officials have 
staled that their primary 
choice is to locate the 
entire systems in Utah and 
Nevada.

Sarpalius said location of 
part of the system in Texas 
would lake up several 
thousand acres of prime 
agriculture land in West 
Texas.

The measure now goes 
to the House for 
consideration.

* * * *

Study may provide in­
telligence but it takes 
thinking to develop 
wisdom.

“IT ’S A B IG  J O B . . .

V

"S le w in g  d o w n  th e  r is in g  c o s ts  o l 
a n y th in g  th e s e  d a y s  E ve n  y o u r  e le c ­
t r ic ity

Y ou  ve g o t s o m e o n e  w o rk in g  o n  it  to r  
y o u  in  th e  S o u th w e s t S o u th w e s te rn  
P u b lic  S e rv ic e  is  u s in g  W y o m in g  
c o a l to  m a k e  e le c t r ic i ty  in  its  n e w  
p o w e r  p la n ts  B e c a u s e  s o m e  o f th e  
o ld  p la n ts  ru n  o n  fu e l th a t ju s t p la in  
c o s ts  to o  m u c h

E le c t r ic i ty  c o u ld  c o s t a lo t  m o re  th a n  
it d o e s  B u t th a n k  g o o d n e s s  it 
d o e s n 't  -  b e c a u s e  o f n o a l
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The Windy Season Is Here!
Now Is The Time To Call

Plainview Overhead Door
293-8577

For All Your Commercial & Residential 
Door & Operator Needs

Offering: Dependable Service, Complete Line Of 
JXetv Doors & Operators.

Free Mileage & Free Estimates 
See The Pros At Plainview Overhead Door

Library
Bailey County Journal. Mulcshoe. Texas, 

coupons on hand, and ex- enjoyed the library thru

Coni. From Page I 
week."

Special displays will be 
History Projects of winning 
awards in County and re­
gional fairs from the Jr. 
High School.

There will be a "Fight­
ing Inflation" display set 
up with a large box for a 
coupon exchange, and the 
book Cushing hi At The 
Checkout which (ells how 
anyone can save at least 
half of their grocery dollar, 
by taking advantage of the 
free and eenls-off coupons 
offered in magazines and 
newspapers, so everyone 
who wants to save money, 
nd who doesn’t?, can come 
and browse thru the many

change if they so desire.
Wednesday morning, 

sforyhour will be held at 10 
a.m. for the Goodwill Kin­
dergarten children and the 
Special Education students 
from the elementary 
schools, along with their 
teachers. A special film 
will be shown, an animated 
film. "The Magic Book" 
about small children and 
the wornderful world of 
books in a library.

Wednesday afternoon at 
4 p.m. the "Library Family 
of Year" will be named 
and honored by the Mule- 
slmc Studcy Club, who 
have made this annual 
presentation for the past 14 
years. This award is made 
to a family who have all

regular use throughout the 
past year, and who have a 
good library record.

Thursday, Friday (10 a. 
in. -6p.m.) and Saturday 
morning (9 a.m.-!2 noon) 
the Study Club will conduct 
their annual "Used Book 
Sale" in the basement of 
the library with all kinds of 
honk bargains.

The Study Club would 
like to have used books of 
all kinds donated for this 
sale. The money which all 
go for new books or equip­
ment for the library.

Sunday, April 5, 1981, Page 7

Cattle...
Coni. From Page I

The meeting should be 
of interest to all beef pro­
ducers in the area, as some 
new research findings on 
Lilt a lyse will be presented.

The meeting is spon­
sored by the Livestock 
Committee of the Program 
Building Committee in co­
operation with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension 
Service and the Bailey 
County Extension office. 
This meeting is free and 
open to the public.

Ellis Funeral Home
24 Hour Ambulance Service

Ph. 272-4574 Mulenhoe
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WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS

We’re proud to give you more!
Ŵ IÎ FFILIATED 

I I foodsinc.
VIVBIR SfORI

#

i

SHURFIHE TOMATO

CATSUP
SHURFRESH QUARTERS

M argarine
SHURFIHE TOMATO

SAUCE i
SHURFIHE PAPER

TOWELS
SHURFIHE

BLEACH ..,
SHURFIHE STRAWBERRY

Preserves ■ &

SHURFIHEPORKARD 3 ^ 1  (1(1
BEANS s T l

OPEN 24 
HOUBSADAY ^ 9 )

lau

i
N m U M l/S K E n M

SHUBFBESH 
BISCUITS

SHURFIHE SLICED

PlHEAPPLE
SHURFIHE

SPINACH
SHURFIHE WAFFLE

SYRUP

IP RERULAR ELECTRIC PEI

SHURFIHE
COFFEE

iu .
JAR

WHOLE KERHEL

SHURFIHE
CORN

tsu .
. cm

12 iz.
in .

SHURFIHE

HAMBUR8ER SLICED DILL

PICKLES 12 IZ. | 
Ml

SHURFIHE CHUHK STYLE

TUNA

BLACKEYE
PEAS

3$10(
15 OZ ■
CANS

3$1
17 OZ ■

i cm  •

0 0

•</■ IZ. 
CM

ALL PURPOSE

SHURFINE 
FLOUR

}

CHEESE
I CHIT

1112. 
. PM.

SHURFIHE EARLY JURE

PEAS
SHURFIHE FRIHT

COCKTAIL

SLICED YELLOW CLIMB

SHURFINE
PEACHES

m .

to iz.
CM

SHURFIHE PIRK

SALMON 1SI2.
CM

SHURFINE VEGETABLE

Shortening

m m i a - r M i H i
I

\ OPEN M S 
BAYS A YEAR

ICE CREAM (

PRICES EFFECTIVE APRN. S -11.1M 1 
WHILE SUPPLY LASTS

ALLSUP’S
C O N V E N IE N C E  STO RES
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Calendar 
★  Of *

Events1

Monday. April 6 -- FHA/ 
HERO Week April 6-10; 
Siudcnl Council Officer E- 
leclion Campaigning April 
6-10
Friday. April 10 -  Student 
Council Assembly. “ Any­
thing Goes"; Competition 
between Classes in HS 
Gvm
Saturday. April II -  UIL
Area One Act Play Contest 
at Plainvicw; Denver City 
Track Meet; Girls' District 
Track Meet

Jr.-Sr. Banquet 
Servers Chosen

Last Sunday, the com­
mittee to choose the serv­
ers for the Junior-Senior 
Banquet met and selected 
the servers. The girls 
chosen were Kelly Baylcss. 
Annette Crabtree. Rhonda 
Dunham. Martha Flores. 
Tori Hunt. Laura Leal, 
Berna Lopez, Sandra Mar­
tinez. Sandra Speck, Crys­
tal Taylor. Charli Hawkins, 
and Sandra Agundis. The 
boys chosen were Darin 
Bratcher. Scott Campbell, 
Jeff Combs. Zcke Contre­
ras. Scott Ellard. Raul 
Garcia. Todd Holt. Leroy 
Hurtado. Chubby Ramos. 
Rene Rcyijs. Freddy Vela, 
and Todd Thornton. 
Michael Isaac was selected 
as host and Jancllc Burks 
as hostess.

The committee will meet 
at a later date to discuss 
the server's costumes.

Muleshoe
School
Lunch

MONDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk. Cereal. Fruit 
LUNCH

Milk
Steak & Gravy 
Creamed Potatoes 
English Peas 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit

TUESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk. Honey Bun. Juice 
LUNCH

Milk
Juicy Burgers 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Pickles & Onions 
Taler Tots

WEDNESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk. Toast. Jelly. Fruit 
LUNCH

Milk
Skillet Dinner 
Pinto Beans 
Jcllo Salad 
Cornbrcad
Peanut Butter Confection 

THURSDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk. Honey Bun. Juice 
LUNCH

Milk
Chicken Salad Sandwiches 
Taler Tots 
Pork & Beans 
Fruit

FRIDAY
BREAKFAST

Milk. Toast. Oatmeal. 
Fruit

LUNCH
Milk
Burrilos

DECA/MDA Winners 
From Rock-A-Thon

Winners of the competi­
tion for having turned in 
the most monev for the

•

DECA''Muscular Dystro­
phy Rock-A-Thon by Fri­
day. March 27 were an­
nounced this week. First 
place winner was Kristy 
Campbell, eighth grade 
student with $189.70; sec­
ond place was senior stu­
dent Richard Orozco with 
$137.00; and thirs place 
winner was Lori Del Toro, 
high school sophomore 
with $133.JO. First place 
winner received a "Mule- 
shoe Mules" windbreaker; 
second place won a "Mule 
Mania" shirt: and third 
place received a check for 
$5.00.

Donna Horn 
Wins At 
Area FHA

Donna Horn, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Hutton 
became the new secretary- 
treasurer of Area l. Future 
Homemakers of America at 
the Area Convention in 
Lubbock March 28. Offi­
cers were elected from all 
over the Panhandle of 
Texas before a house of 
delegates. Donna compe­
ted for the office against 
qualifiers from Abernathy 
and Littlefield. The incom­
ing officer candidates were 
interviewed by the outgo­
ing officers and were asked 
questions concerning the 
office for-w hich they ran.

The office of secretary- 
treasurer carries with it a 
tremendous responsibility. 
Not only arc accurate 
minutes of all area busi­
ness meetings required but 
accurate and efficient rec­
ords of all monetary mat­
ters. Donna's new office 
makes her eligible to at­
tend the FHA slate meet­
ing in San Antonio and the 
national meeting in San 
Francisco this summer.

The entire FHA chapter 
is very proud of Donna for 
achieving this great 
accomplishment.

Pledges are still being 
collected and a great deal 
or money is being turned in 
daily. DECA would like to 
encourage anyone w'ho has 
not turned in his collec­
tions to do so as soom as 
possible.

Congratulations to the 
three winners and all of the 
participants in the Rock-A- 
rhon and to Muleshoe for 
its civic consciousness ef­
forts.
DEC A "Devclo/Hug Future 
I voders for Murketing and 
Distribution.

★  Happy ★  
Birthday

\pril 7 - Derek Prater. Lola 
Martinez
April 10 - Michelle Agee 
April II - Marv Franco. 
Arnold Ontivcroz

DONNA HORN

Q K S S iFT.A. 
Will Sell 
Popcorn

The FTA will be selling 
popcorn till during the day 
every Wednesday until 
Easter. The machine will 
he located near the office. 
\ll bags will sell for 25 
cents. Everyone is urged to 
buy a bag and help support 
the local chapter of Future 
Teachers of America.

Student Council 
Is Hard At Work

The Student Council had 
a busy February and
March.

Four members helped 
with the Faster Seals Tele­
thon in Lubbock. March 28 
and 29. They answered 
phones, look down pledges 
and ran errands for this 
worthy cause. Participating 
were Darin Bratcher. Jua­
nita Lozano. Crystal 
Taylor. Marie Cox. and 
lan d  Shain.

The Foreign Exchange 
Program was discussed. 
Students interested in go­
ing abroad for their Senior 
voar of High School are to 
get in touch with Mrs. Lola 
Pvlani. Also any family 
interested in boarding an 
exchange student in their 
lwtine needs to talk with 
Mrs. Pvlani.

Phone collections were 
made Wednesday. Fcbru-

7S

Muleshoe High Schitol 
FHA HERO Chapters have 
planned several activities 
for the week of April 6-10. 
These activities arc de­
signed to exhibit leader­
ship. pride and loyally to 
our organization and 
school. Here’s what you 
can expect!

Monday
Window Car Wash in 

high school parking lot, 
members dress in overalls 
ami red bandanas. Mem­
bers witt select- -honorary- 
members for 1 day only, a 
luncheon will be served to 
those that arc selected. Be 
sure l)i wear the badge that 
signifies you are honorary, 
it will be given to you by a 
member.

T uesday
Teacher Tribute. Softball 

Game FHA vs. HERO at
7;3fi.

Wednesday
Two Chocolate Bunny 

Rabbits will be hidden in 
the halls; seek and you 
shall find. Children’s Party 
5:30-6:30 for our special 
little friends. Students will 
Ik- asked to wear a GREEN 
ribbon showing sympathy 
and love for the families of 
those children murdered in 
Atlanta. Georgia.

One Act Play Wins District

Hie Morning Watch is 
,*tie of the responsibilities 
dt.n Student Council has 
assumed. Two volunteers 
from Student Council arc 
iii charge of the Morning 
Watch each week.

The second Blood Drive 
has been postponed until 
M.tv 13. Hopefully many 
donors will give blood for 
ibis worthy cause.

Student Council will be 
luisv next week with the 
campaigning ami elections 
of new officers The state 
convention will be hold in 
D ill.is on April 23 25.

SMILES ®
Lmw

The housewife whose 
young daughter was helping 
her in the kitchen heard a 
loud crash. "More dishes?” 
she cried in desperation.

“ No. Mama, less." was

Muleshoe High’s One 
Act Play. Oedipus (he King 
won the district champion­
ship this past Tuesday. 
Carla Shafer received the 
best actress award and 
Michael Isaac was selected 
best actor. Julius Briscoe 
was named to the all star 
cast along with Freddie 
Vela. Jeff Combs, and Lori 
Butler receiving honorable 
mention awards.

Mulcshoe’s play will

compete in the Area con­
test April 11 at Plainvicw 
High School. Winners 
there will advance to re­
gional.

Other cast members and 
crew arc Marlin Bynum, 
Scott Ellard, David Pruitt. 
Dale Hughes. Sandra 
Graves. Danny Scales. 
I.ynncllc Shafer. Marvin 
Lewis. Kevin Robinson. 
Jimmy Lee. Dana Brewer, 
and Sheri Ellard.

Ag Coop Students 
Are Highlighted

DECA/MDA ROCK-A-THON WINNERS..... These stu­
dents won awards for turning in the most money for the 
recently held Rock-A-Thon. Pictured L-R are Lori Del 
Toro, Richard Orozco, and Kristi Campbell.

FHA-HERO Week 
Set April 6-10

Thursday
Lunch Box Auction.... 

Members will each make a 
WONDERFUL meal, 
sowed in a decorated box. 
Tile auction will be held in 
the choir room next to the 
cafeteria. Meals start off at 
a $1.50 and the person who 
bids the most will get that 
lunch box. We have some 
very exciting lunch boxes, 
so you better plan to gel 
there early. Mom and Dad 
Supper - will be held in the 
HE Department for the 
|Cirent’s of HERO mem­
bers. Each member is 
bringing a covered dish 
and games will be played 
afterwards. Dress Up Like 
a KNOCK OUT Day - 
members will be dressed in 
a very dressy way.

Friday
Take up Slack Day - 

casual attire of SUNGLAS­
SES. JEANS. T-SHIRT, 
and TENNIS SHOES.

We hope that everyone 
can enjoy this week of 
activities that have been 
planned by our chapters. If 
you forget what is planned 
for a certain day, just listen 
1st period every morning 
and watch for bulletin 
board messages.

Muleshoe High School 
offers two classes of Ag 
Coop. Coop 1 and Coop II. 
This class is designed for 
those students who arc not 
planning to attend college. 
The students gel a job and 
then work during one or 
two class periods. The stu­
dents keep records of their 
work because they have a 
minimum number of hours 
they must work per week. 
These students also receive 
credit for the periods they 
work. The Mule's Talc 
Staff is happy to recognize 
members participating in 
Ag Coop.

Jamey Chanccy is the 16 
year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Red Chanccy. His 
activities include art and 
FFA. He is a junior. He 
comments: "Learning can 
be FUN!"

Curby Brantley, an 18 
year old senior participates 
in FFA. FCA. and FTA. 
His parents arc Mr. and 
Mrs. Curby Brantley. Sr.

Mark Calloway, the son 
of Benny and Vera Calla­
way. is a 19 year old 
senior.

Larry Nowell is a 17 year 
old senior. His parents arc 
Derrell and Linda Nowell.

Richard Orozco, the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Orozco, is a 19 year old 
senior. He is a member of 
FTA. Student Council and 
FFA. He commented: "It 
is all right if you are 
willing to learn about Ag 
Coop."

Joey Carpenter is active 
in FFA. Church, and Bap­
tist Men. He is the 18 year 
old son of Mr. and Mrs. 
lim Carpenter. He com­
mented: "This is a very 
good class with good 
learning and skills if you 
get our and do it."

Rudy Orozco is a junior 
and is Ift years old. His 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Orozco.

Kenny Chanccy is 18 
and a senior. He is em­
ployed at Plains Auto. He 
is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Wed Chancev.

I vnn Moore is active in 
Tri State Rodeo. FFA and 
Karate. He is Ift and the

Speech Wins At 

W.T.S.U.
The Speech Contest 

Squad won the sweep­
stakes championship at the 
West Texas State Univer­
sity Speech Tournament 
this past weekend. Twenty 
nine teams with four hun­
dred entries were entered 
in the six event meet.

Sandra Graves placed 
second in poetry, and Jul­
ius Briscoe third in poetry; 
Stacey Barnhill won third 
place in informative speak­
ing: and Dannv Scales and 
Staeev Barnhill received 
third in duct acting while 
lelT Combs and Freddie 
Vela placed first in duet 
acting.

The West Texas Tourn­
ament was the speech 
squad's last invitational

son of Dewey and Judy 
Moore. He is employed at 
Mohawk Auto Parts. He 
commented: "Coop is 
great because I enjoy get­
ting out to work half of a 
day."

Casey Farmer, the 18 
year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Farmer is 
active in FFA and 4-H and 
likes rodeos. Casey com­
mented: "W e have had a 
good year. We have ,two 
good teachers who have 
helped us start some new 
programs. They have 
planned a new ag farm 
which will make it better in 
the years to come."

Wesley Rasco is the 19 
year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Odell Rasco. He en- 
jovs FTA. FFA and athle­
tics. His comments were. 
"This year has taught us a 
lot. It has taught us the 
responsibility of a job and 
elassxvork."

Starla Black is the 17 
year old daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ronnie Black and 
she enjoys checrlcading. 
FTA and FFA.

Jim Overman, the 18 
year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bcrlc Overman, is 
active in FFA. He com­
mented. "I try to do the 
best 1 can and help every­

one that needs help."
Curtis Hunt is the 18 

vear old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Hunt, and he 
is a member of FFA and 
FTA. His comments were. 
"In Ag Coop you get to 
work with people who like 
the same kind of work you 
do. and get a belter un­
derstanding of your job 
occupation."

Brian Powell, the 17 year 
old son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Powell, is active 
in FFA.

Jeff Durben is the 18 
year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Durben. He is a 
Senior at MHS and enjoys 
\g  Coop.

Joe Lopez is the 19 year 
old son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Pilar Lopez. He enjoys Ag 
Coop and is a Senior at 
MHS.

Johnny Puckett is a 
senior at MHS. He is the 
I7 year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J.H. Puckett. He is 
active in FTA. He is em­
ployed at Puckett and 
Clark Trucking and com­
ments: "This year we have 
had a great time. We have 
worked hard and have 
learned a lot."

Ag Coop instructors are 
Mr. Terry Singleton and 
Mr. James Tavlor.

HERO Members 
Attend Convention

Muleshoe High School 
HERO Chapter members, 
who were specially selec­
ted by a point system set 
up by Mrs. Furgcson at­
tended a convention in 
honor of AREA I FHA/ 
HERO Members at Texas 
Tech University in Lub­
bock, March 27-28.

To start the convention 
off. Area 1 Vice President 
of HERO. Shelli Hawkins 
was mistress of ceremony 
for the evening. Serving as 
special hostesses were 
Nancy Garcia. Awyna Cox. 
and Donna Hawkins, as 
well as six other girls from 
Canyon and Clarendon. 
During the banquet. OUT­
STANDING HERO MEM­
BERS from the entire area 
were recognized by Miss 
Hawkins. Lori Hartlinc of 
Muleshoe represented her 
chapter as (hat student 
voted to be most outstan­
ding for accomplishment. 
After the banquet. Jacinda 
Gleason. Sally Lunsford 
and Shelli Hawkins atten­
ded the House of Dele­
gates. Jacinda was running 
Ibr the same office that 
Shelli presently holds. Ja­
cinda was defeated in a 
close race by Danny Mar­
quez of Littlefield. The 
HERO Chapter would like 
to express how proud we 
are of Jacinda, she was a 
well deserving candidate. 
However, if Danny should 
happen to win the same 
office at Stale Level. Ja­
cinda would immediately 
take over at the area level. 
Representing Muleshoe

legislation concerning the 
Area, as well as selection 

1 of Area Officers.
Members not attending 

the HOUSE OF DELE­
GATES attended workshop 
sessions on "Teenage 
Pregnancy.” "Alcohol­
ism.”  "Communication,” 
"Looking and Feeling 
Good." and "Getting a Job 
and Keeping It."

Saturday Morning Gen­
eral Session concluded the 
Area I Convention for 
1981. Serving as hostesses 
were Sally Lunsford. Nancy 
Garcia and Lori Hartline.

Special greetings were 
given by individuals in 
AREA 1 who have been 
supporting the organiza­
tion for many years. Rep­
resenting Area I Young 
Homemakers was Jean 
Richardson of Muleshoe. 
Mrs. Richardson presently 
serves at Area I President 
of YHT. Special guests 
were seated on stage that 
morning including Mrs. 
Mary Furgcson and Mrs. 
Dorinc Harbin.

HERO would like to ex­
press a jugc THANK YOU 
to Mrs. Margaret Gleason 
for her time and sponsor­
ship for that action-packcd 
weekend. We could not 
have done it without your 
help!

©SMILES
That Soft

"Your husband told my 
husband that his word at 
home was law.”

"Oh yes? Well, It’s one of 
those laws that is never



By Spencer Tanksley

County Extension Agent

While it's best to seed 
sonic vegetables directly in 
the home garden, others 
do best if transplanted.

In this area of Texas 
tomatoes, peppers and 
eggplant should always be 
set out in the garden as 
transplants. The reason for 
this is the weather. These 
vegetables are somewhat 
fickle when it comes to 
ideal environmental condi­
tions for setting fruit. 
Bloom and fruit set must 
occur before temperatures

gel too high. Setting out 
11 ansplants after danger of 
all frost allows these plants 
10 b*ooni during ideal con­
ditions and to set a bounti­
ful harvest during optimum 
weather.

You can also transplant 
such so-called “ cool sea­
son’' crops such as cab­
bage, cauliflower, broccoli, 
lettuce and onions. This 
allo’vs them to mature un­
der ideal conditions and 
also saves growing time in 
the garden. Using trans-

FARM
SERVICE YOU CAN TRUST

For
prompt
service,
Call:
272-3420

plants can lessen the gar- 
denl growing time by sev­
eral months or more. How­
ever, setting out trans­
plants of crops such as 
okra, squash, cucumbers 
and melons offers no real 
advantage and is usually 
not a recommended prac­
tice.

What about the “ how" 
of transplanting? Handle 
transplants like eggs! 
Make every effort to avoid 
undue stress to young 
plants. Be sire  plants do 
not suffer from lack of 
moisture, wind damage or 
excessive heat prior to and 
immediately after trans­
planting.

Most plants that are a- 
vailablc locally will be 
growing in plantable con­
tainers such as peat pots or 
peat cubes. If possible, 
plan to transplant during 
late afternoon or at least on 
a cloudy day. I personally 
think it’s a good idea to set 
your transplants in a buc­
ket or pan of water for 
several minutes prior to 
planting so the root system 
is thoroughly wet.

Determine the proper 
spacing for the crop and 
dig a hole 4 inches wide 
and 4 lob inches deep. Put

about a cupful of water 
directly in the hole and 
allow it to soak in. Set the 
transplant in the center of 
the hole and fill in with 
soil. Make certain the peat 
container is completely be­
neath the soil level as it 
may act like a wick and 
rapidly dry out the root- 
ball. thus killing the plant.

Depth of planting is im­
portant and often begin­
ners make the mistake of 
setting plants too deep in 
the soil. Set most trans­
plants only slighly deeper 
than they were originally 
growing. If tomato plants 
arc tall and "leggy", plant 
them as shown in the 
accompanying drawing. If 
plant roots arc set too deep 
below the soil level, espe­
cially in heavy soils, they 
will be slow to grow and 
the plant will have to 
prt>ducc roots along the 
stem near the surface. The 
original roots may, or may 
not. grow eventually. Ei­
ther way. the advantages 
of transplanting arc lost 
and harvest may be de­
layed greatly.

When filling the hole 
with soil at planting, leave 
a slight depression around 
the plant to hold additional

O S VISA

301 N. First •  2 7 2 -3 4 2 0  

M anager: John Robinson

GREAT PLAINS REPLICAS.. ...Wilma Smith’s fifth grade
class was busy making replicas of objects seen during the 
“ Settlement of the Great Plains. Chris Faulkner, Ali Cage, 
and Sergio Gonzales show the different fences used during 
this time. Annette Davis made a windmill and Kevin 
Truelove made a sod house. •M

During The Month Of April

Your last chance 
for great savings 
on better Bemco'
P o s tu re  S u p rem e®

mattress sets
Our buying power means 

beautiful buys for you. And 
you can count on Bemco 
quality for solid sleeping  
com fort. Coil Guard con­
struction, multi-needle quilt 
to polyurethane. Heavy duty, 
tempered coils. Extra firm 
box spring.

T W IN  S IZE

X .
SOW iR t f t l  <H«Y

F U L L  S IZE

" f  152: '

W l  in M il MW

Q U E E N  SIZE  
Reg $600

*299=
K IN G  SIZE 
Reg. $790

‘ 395=
M a m r fa c tu r t r t  » u g g *« la d  ra ta il p r te t

Johnson Furniture
2104 W. A m e r ic a n  Bivd. = 1  ^  y ,  r * r *

water from spot watering 
or from rainfall. Also pro­
tect young plants for a 
week or so from high wind 
and excessive heal. This 
can be done easily by 
placing a shingle, board, 
milk carton or some similar 
protection on the windy or

D R U G  Q U I Z
b y  C u r t  S c a rb o ro u g h ,  P h  D  

U se d  b y  p e rm is s io n ;  a l l  r ig h ts  r e ­
se rve d  b y  D A T E ,  S t .  L o u is .  M o .
Q U E S T IO N  W h ic h  o f  the  
fo l lo w in g  g ro u p s  has the  
h ighes t ra te  o f d ru g  a d d ic t io n ?

a) P ro fe ss io n a l a th le te s
b ) D o c to rs  and  nurses
c) L a w ye rs
d ) S c h o o l a d m in is t ra to rs  

a nd  teachers
A N S W E R  D o c to rs  and  nurses 
have fa r h ig h e r ra tes  o f  d ru g  
a d d ic t io n  th a n  have a ll o th e r  
g roups  o f  p ro fe s s io n a ls  says a 
re p o rt f r o m  th e  T exas Re 
search In s t i tu te  o f  M e d ic a l 
Sciences, H o u s to n . S o n d ra  K. 
S t ic k n c y , c h ie f nu rse  a t the  
in s t itu te 's  c l in ic a l research 
u n it ,  says th a t a d d ic t io n  has 
been re p o r te d  in  a p p ro x  1 
m a te ly  o n e  o u t  o f  4 0 0  p h y s i 
cians. T h is  c o m p a re s  to  ad 
d ic t io n  ra tes  a m o n g  th e  gen 
era l p o p u la t io n  o f  o ne  o u t  o f  
4 .0 0 0

G e n e ra lly , a c c e s s ib ility  to  
n a rc o tic s  appears  to  be a k e y  
fa c to r  to  a d d ic t io n ,  b u t  o v e r 
w o rk ,  c h ro n ic  fa t ig u e , in s o m  
ma, p ro g ess iona t f ru s tra t io n s , 
and d o m e s tic  o r  m a r ita l 
in s ta b il i ty  a lso  are c ite d  as 
causes. M s. S t ic k n e y  no tes  
th a t th o u g h  o u tc o m e s  va ry  
( fro m  27%  to  9 2 % ), th e  p ro  
fess iona l's  re c o v e ry  ra te  is 
m u ch  h ig h e r th a n  th e  a cce p te d  
5%  to  15%  fo r  th e  " t y p ic a l "  
abuser.

C o rre c t answ er - b .

sunny side of the plant. A 
can placed around the 
transplant when it is set in 
the garden will also pre­
vent damage from pesky 
cutworms.

So much for the art of 
transplanting. Next I’ll go 
into greater detail on how
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1 a l i t  ( i i ' r u i r  l i i n v i l i i / i .  .........  wto grow tomatoes like you 
have never grown them 
before.

Modern Sponge
A-Do you know your wife 

is telling it around that you 
can’t keep her in 
clothes?

B-That’s nothing. I 
bought her a home and I 
can’t keep her in that, either.

The reticulated python of 
southeastern Asia has been 
known to grow to 28 feet.

High Fashion. 
Low Price.
ArtCarved's miniature high school rings 
are now on sale.

Popular petite rings from ArtCarved 
come in six different styles. Crafted in * 
elegant 10Kyellow or white gold, one 
of them is just right fo r you.
Flattering, fresh, feminine.
Come in with this ad to 
get this very special offer.

Lindsey Jewelry

202 Main Muleshoe 272-3355

J i E S & i S i S i i l i QUALITY
Cordovan 
Sovereign

Aramld Belted Radial
A R A M ID  B E L T E D  —  T h e  ! t 

■ vteongeM t+re «aeek- ever
nidWieloped, the strength of

s te e l w ith  less  w e ig h t  
A R A M ID  is  m u c h  m o re  
f le x ib le  - -  fo r  a m u c h  m o re  
c o m fo r ta b le  r id e  
A R A M I D  p r o d u c e s  a 
l ig h te r ,  e a s ie r  r o l l in g  t i r e  
w h ic h  im p r o v e s  g a s  
e c o n o m y
A R A M ID  a b s o rb s  m o re  
ro a d  s h o ck  — e l im in a te s  
jo in t  s la p  a n o  p ro v id e s  
g re a te r  im p a c t  re s is ta n c e

Pill*
S E T
E t c h

Tu he irs '* K rg u la r Sale
U h i le w a ll P r ic e P r k r

S iie Each ?nd T i r r
P2I5/75R15 . . .. 77.30 69.57
P225/75R13 . . . 81.76 73.58
P235/75R15 . . . 84.94 76.45

Num ber

No. 23( 45 
No. 23C49 
Nq. 23(84

For years Steel belted radiais have been the establish­
ed standard of the industry , now 
Aram id —  the space age tire cord material has been 
developed by Dupont laboratories to replace steel as a 
belt material in radial tires. Aramid is the ideal 
material for tires because it combines the toughness 
and durability of steel at one fifth of the weight with the 
comfort and smooth ride of a fabric belted radial.

Premier IV Polyester 

Steel wnitemrall

Constructed with 2 belts of steel 
cord and 2stough body plies of 
Polyester Cord. Good traction on 
both wet and dry pavement. Hi- 
traction tread compound remains 
flexible at temperatures below 
freenng to maintain good trac 
tion. In many cases it eliminates 
w i n t e r  t i r e  ( h o n g e o v e r .ID

Num ber

H rg u ta r S atr Hlu>
P r i t r f r i e r t  E  T
K a r h * .’nd T i r f E ach

40.96 36.86 1.89
44.65 40.19 2.02

45.37 2.19
.51.25 46.13 2.33
54.67 49.20 2.48

51.86 2.58
59.34 53.41 2.81

. 5 6 .0 8 50.47 2.57
.59.70 53.73 2.75
At r "' " a . V I 55.41 2.93

.65.89 59.30 3.11

FREE MOUNTING & 
COMPUTER BALANCE

I

A
*5 ?

Cordovan

Radial

CR-10

JET STAR 
\\  120 Polyester Cord

J5 ”  Whitewall
1 T h e  4 p ly  p o ly e s te r co rd  body 
re s is ts  im p a c t ,  b lo w  o u ts , 
d e te r io ra tio n . Y g u  get a so fte r, 
q u ie te r  n d e  w ith  no ro ad  w h in e  or 
io m t s lap  and no m o rn in g  th u m p .

No.llCM  
N o.tlC M  
No.CK'45 
N o .S K '4 9  
N o  6 I<  84

T V W Ir ta f t r f a la r Sal* P lea
W S IU -.a U P r tc r P r U r r e .t .

JM ar Each Sad tirr F a r t

G lt7M 4 5 1 .1 7 4 6 .0 5 2 .4 3
H R 7 S I 4 5 3 .5 1 4 8 .1 6 2 .5 9
GR7R-I5 5 2 .8 9 4 7 .6 0 2 .4 1
H R 78 -15 5 4 .3 6 4 8 .8 7 2 .7 5
LR78- I5 5 7 .8 3 5 2 .0 5 2 .9 2

f  f /  /./  /  /  / R rg a la r H a lf P h <
P r k r P r k * P E T

N a a tto r fcacfc ta d  T i r r E ach

A78-I3, Whitewall........ 33.20 26.56 1.50
87*13, Whitewall........ 34.29 27.43 1.61
C7X-I3, tVhitewall........ 36.00 28.80 1.79
C7S-I4, W hitewall.'.... 36.17 28.94 1.68
1)7*14. Whitewall........ ............ 36.61 21.29 1.79
E7S-I4. Whitewall........ 38.96 31.17 2.94
F78-I4, Whitewall........ ............40 96 32.77 2.14
G78-I4. Whitewall........ 42.06 33.65 2.28
H7H-I4. Whitewall 45.33 36.26 2.52
<■78-15. Whitewall........ 43.79 35.03 2.36
117* IS. Whitewall 46.12 36.90 2.57
J7X-I4. WMlewpll........ 48.40 38.70 2 .7 9
1.7*15, Whitewall 49.75 39.80 2.84

L )  1 )  A / N  1  V
K  A IY L H

■ t
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JJuû a&uJ /u u V a h t

QUANTmCS UNITED

*' Monsanto

25-PACK
M  M  M  W h ih  

Suppkes
M M  L u t

LAWN GREEN 
DOORMAT
D u ra b le  lo w - p i le  d o o r ­
m a t w i th  p o ly e th y le n e  
b lades fo r  th o ro u g h  d ir t 
re m o v a l. N o n -sk id  back. 
18x30-in. D M 26

LH. ROUND 
POINT SHOVEL
F eatures  lo n g  w o o d  h a n ­
d le ;  h o l lo w b a c k ,  h e a t-  
t r e a te d ,  h ig h -c a rb o n  
s te e l b la d e  w /r o l le d  
s h ou lde rs . C2LRCSX

QUANTITIES LIMITEO

Supplies
Last30-GAL 

TRASH BAGS
H e a v y -d u ty  2 -p ly  b a g s  
h o ld  u p  to  60 lbs ! Each 
b o x  in c lu d e s  25  b a g s  
p lus  tw is t ties. TV325 

QUANTITES LIMITED

Fry & Cox Inc
2 7 2 -4 5 1 1

TOOL VALUE
OF THE MONTH

BARGAIN
OF THE M O N TH
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The
Sandhills

Philosopher
Editor's note: The Sand­

hills Philosopher on his 
lohiison grass farm on 
Sandy Creek discusses 
luxation this week, sort of.

0 -
Dear editor:

Regardless of what 
school they're unending, a 
large percentage of high 
school students come out 
knowing how to read, just 
as many kids learn how to 
xwin without taking swim­
ming lessons.

Bui one thing students 
don't learn and teachers 
don't even teach is the 
reality of taxation. Sure

leds know there are such 
hittgs as (axes, but that's 

mostly something grown­
ups groan about and dodge 
w hi'tievyr possible. They 
uc not truly and painfully 
aware that their school 
buildings and their books 
are the results of taxation.

\  friend of mine has hit 
on a way to bring home to 
vtHing people the principle 
of taxation, particularly the 
income tax. He says it can 
be done through the re­
distribution of grades.

Say you have a student 
in the high grade bracket, 
averaging 98 or even 100. 
and another in the lower 
bracket, averaging 60. You 
lake 10 points away from 
die former and give them 
to the latter, which brings 
his grade up to 70. and 
ih its nohodv ever fails.

SETTLEMENT OF THE GREAT PLAINS..... Students in
Wilma Smith's class at Mary DeShazo Elementary display 
their projects depicting the settlement of the Great Plains. 
Pictured with their dugout are Michael Garza, Kasey 
Whatley, and Ernest Valverde. Cindy Anguzquino and 
Carry Gonzales made a judge’s office and Winston Stice 
and Greg Garcia made a sod house.

RECIPE i | ( H
By Sarah Anne Sheridan

If your family likes fish, 
you might try this recipe on 
some special occasion. Use 
this for trout, red snapper, or 
flounder.

Stuffed Fish

2 c cooked chopped 
shrip or crabmeat

1 3 to 4 lbs. boned trout
or snapper
2 eggs
1 c cream
2 T butter

Vi c chopped canned or 
fresh mushrooms

2 t chopped chives
1 T flour
4 T sherry

salt and paprika
2 limes or lemons

Mix the shrimp or crab- 
meat. eggs, and Vi cup of the 
cream together. Melt butter 
add mushrooms and chives.
Saute until soft. Jhen add 
flour, stirring well until the 
mixture is bubbling. Add 
shrimp mixture and cook un­
til thick. Place fish in a bak­
ing dish and stuff with mix­
ture. Pour over the remain­
ing cream, sprinkle with salt 
and paprika. Add sherry and 
bake at 350 degrees for 45 
minutes. Serve with wedges 
of fresh lime or lemon and 
sprinkle with fresh chopped 
parsley for color.

Serves 6.

H«R BLOCK
TAX T E S T

Q u e st io n  No. 9

Income
averaging can save 
you money. But only 

If you make more 
ttwn $30,000 a year.

□  Ttoe □  False
What you don't know about income 
averaging could cost you money 

H&R Block knows that no matter ho v 
much you make, i f  your income wem up 
substantially last year you may be able to 
income average. We ll take advantage o 
this i f  it's to your benefit The answer 
is FALSE, since there is no minimum 
imount o f income required to qualify

WE'LL MAKE THE TAX LAWS 
WORK FOR YOU

H*R BLOCK
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE

224 W. 2nd 
272-3332 
Wkdys 9 -6  

Sat. 9 -5

I ho reality of taxation 
• hen Ikyohios a learned 
lownu. particularly to the 
upper bracket student.

Going a little further, 
however, if the lower brac­
ket student, after he limps 
iKottgh school with upper 

bracken assistance, gets 
out into life and makes a 
lot of money, you’ll find he 
has no use for the idea of 
redistribution. This is 
k iows as human nature, 
a ul so far the schools 
h iven’t gotten around to 
offering a course in that 
subject.

Yours faithfully.
.I.A .

* * * * *

You can increase the 
efficiency of a smoke alarm 
system bv locating several 
alarms throughout the 
house -- in different rooms. 
Wire them so that when 
one goes off. they all do. 
says Linda McCormack, a 
family resource manage­
ment specialist.

Mrs. McCormack is on 
the economies staff of the 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, The Texas 
A&M University System.

PU PPET SH O W  Tonya Nowell (left) and Mandy Collins
demonstrate their puppet show with characters from the 
book "Ellen Tibbits” . The project was completed for Beth 
Skipworth’s class and is on display in the library.

Harry L. Everett, DDS
Announces

The Opening Of An Office For 
The Practice Of Orthodontics 

At
1201 Cleveland, Friona, Texas

By Appointment 
806-247-3880

Boot Sale

ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

MULESHOE ASSEMBL Y OF GOD 
517 S. First 

Rev. James Golaz

EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH 
Iglcsia Bautista Emmanuel 
107 E. Third 
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor

RIGHLAND HILLS BAPTIST CHURCH 
17th and West Ave. D 

Brock Sanders. Pastor

SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
Rev. Aradio Gonzalez 
East Third and Ave. E

TRINITY BA PTIST CHURCH
314 Ave. B
Don Knight. Pastor

LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH 
B.C. Stoneciphcr. Pastor 
Phone 940-3413 

SIXTEENTH AND A VE.
D CHURCH OF CHRIST 
James Johnson. Pastor 
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Progress, Texas 
Danny Jackson
NORTH SIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
117 E. Birch Street

SPANISH ASSEMBL Y OF GOD 
East 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. Hipolito Pecina

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE

207 E. Ave. G 
George Green. Pastor

MULESHOE BAPTIST CHURCH 
8th and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd, Pastor

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. J.F.. Meeks

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Ninth and Ave. C 

|{cv. David Olay. Pastor

D O O R
O P E N E R S

Keys and churches are door openers. In both 
cases, each requi re you to put forth some effort. 
The key you must insert in the lock and turn. 
Our I,ord made the way to heaven even easier, 
for all that you have to do is present yourself 
and believe.
“For hy grace a ir yc sared through fa ith; and 
that not of yourselves: it is the gift  of God: 
Not of works lest any man should boast: For 

we are his workmanship, created in Christ 
Jesus unto good works, which God hath before 

ordained that we should walk in them."

j&VSTItov

Coleman Adv S«r*

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W. Ave. G 
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School - 10 a.m.
Worship - 11 a.m.

LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSION 
Ave. D and Fifth Street 
R.Q- Chavez, Pastor

THE COMMUNITY CHURCH 
H.D. Hunter, Pastor 
Morton Highway

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
James Williams, Pastor 
1733 W. Ave. C

PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
Rev. Bill Kent
507 W. Second, Muleshoe

ST. JOHN LUTHERAN 
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter. Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m.
Worship - 11 a.m.

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 South First
Elder Bernard Gowens

MULESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
David Cox, Minister 
Clovis Highway

JEHOVAH WITNESS 
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Minister

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH

Father Patrick Mahat
Northeast of City in Morrison Additon

ST. MA TTHEW BAPTIST CHURCH 
Corner of West Boston & West Birch 
Rev. M.S. Brown, Pastor

W E S T E R N  W E A K  hie,

Muleshoe Home 
Center, Inc.

T  Western 
t r e e ’s Wear Inc.
1910W.Amer.Blvd. 272-4663

¥ w  —
iH * ®  „  272-1511

^^Dairg 
k Queen

. Margie Hawkins 
f t  Manager 
^  272-3412

Good News 
Book Store

106E. Ave. B. 
Bibles. MusUfi Books

Muleshoe Co-op 
Gins

White’s Cashway 
Grocery

Where Friends Meet and Prices Talk

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B 272-1288

Robert Green Inc.
Your I Mdsmobile, (»M( P on tiac , 

Buick Dealer
W.Hwy.84 272-4588

Dent-Rempe 
Implement Co.

John Deere Dealer 
Muleshoe 272-4297

Western Drug
114 Main

Western Sprinklers 
Inc.

V *  ZINMATXC 272-4544

Main Street Beauty 
______ Salon_______

Kemp’s Discount
____ Ifiirnllurp_____

Muleshoe 
Publishing Co. Muleshoe Body

_____________ _________________________
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Deadline For Classified Ads Is 11:00 
Taesdays And Fridays

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion,

Per W ords. 15 
Minimum Charge- 

52.00
2nd Insertion,
Per word-S. 13 
3rd Insertion,

Per Word-S. 10 
Minimum Charge 

51.80
1/3 Cheaper to run

Classifieds 3 times or more 
CARD OF THANKS 

25 words -53 
Over 25 words 

charged at regular 
classified rates 

Classified Display- 
51. 55 per column inch 

Double Rate for 
3lindAds 

DEADLINE FOR 
INSERTION 

11a.m. Tues. forThurs. 
11 a. m. Fri. for Sun. 
WE RESER VE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

AN Y AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 

AFTER AD HAS RUN
ONCE.

#**«**••*•••*•••**•*•*
I. PERSONALS

PHOTOGRAPHY BY 
OECIA

For a lifetime of memories, 
let us put your wedding in 
beautiful pictures. Call 
Oecia for your date. 
385-5169. 512 Phelps. Lit­
tlefield. Tx. 79339.

____________ „____
W E BUY

USED FURNITURE AND 
APPLIANCES  
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
1 -18s-tfc

Horseback riding and 
safety training for ages 
8 on up. Basic horse 
back skills, western 
pleasure, horsemanship 
and care of animals 
For more information 
call 272-5317 after 6 
p.tn. or 272-3567 during 
business hours for 
Jennie.
I-Lls-lfc

BOB’S SAFETY 
CENTER 

I will be in my office at 
320 E. American Blvd. 
Mulcshoc. Texas part 
time beginning 4-1-81.

Bob Burris 
l-!4s-4tc

The family of L.C. 
Winkler would like to ex­
press our sincere thanks to 
our good friends in Mulc­
shoc and surrounding area. 
The flowers, cards and 
phone calls were deeply 
appreciated during the 
lengthy illness and loss of 
our daddy. Thanks again 
and may God Bless you all.

Marv Lou. Larry. Terry, 
and Jcrrvc Winkler 

I-14s-lie

Let us start your colt' 
right! FITTING & CON 
01 HONING FOR RACE 
SHOWS OR SALES. 
ALSO: Standing at stud 
Lucky Bug Rex AQHA 
#1.226.560 ROM - SI- 88 
Conformation and disposi 
lion plus. Rocking F Quar 
ter Horses. P.O. Box 385. 
Midesboe, Texas 79347,

2. LOST AND FOUND 
*** *** ••««***• •* ***•* *•

LOST: Female dark blue 
heeler. Answer's to the 
name of Ethel. Approxi­
mately 3 vis. old. Lost in 
Clovis around March 6. 
Reward givne! Call collect 
| W51 762-7879.
2 l.lvbte

LOST: Large black and 
white cat with stubtail. 
Lost in the Richland Hills 
area. Please call 272-5464. 
Reward Given!
2- 14s-lie
•* * ••* * ••* •* •••* * * ••••

3. HELP WANTED

PICK YOUR OWN 
REWARDS WITH AVON 

Good $S$. nice people, 
great prizes. Call Nettie 
272-3208; Oneida 272-3346.
3 I4t-2tc

Good Pay working from 
home, processing mail for 
us. No experience re­
quired. Part or full time. 
Start immediately. For in­
formation and application, 
send stamped, self- 
addressed envelope to: 
Colfax Publications. Box 
1135. Newberry, Florida 
32669.
3- 9s-12tc

HELP WANTED: Beauty 
operators in new facility 
with good working condi­
tions. Apply in person at 
1002 North Main. Friona. 
Texas 79035 or call 
247-2210 from 9-6.
3- 7t-tfc

Necd men to work on 
roofing crew. Composition 
and cedar shingles. Ex­
perience preferred but will 
train. Call 227-2098 Sudan. 
Texas.
3 14s tfe

PUMP BUSINESS 
EXPANDING

Wanted experienced pump 
rig operators. Top pay for 
the right man. Year round 
job. For futhcr information 
call 238-1.596 or 238-1328 
nights.
.3 I4s-6ic
**'.«****••••«*•••**•***»•*»-.• 
4. HOUSES FOR RENT

TRAILER FOR RENT 
14 X 68. 2 bedroom. I 
bath, furnished, central air 
and heat. 257-3776 Earth.
4- 12s-tfe

S. APTS. FOR RENT 
« * » « * * * * 4 « * * * e * * « a * * * * *

For Rent
Offices for Rent 

302W.2nd
272 3107

REAL ESTATE

FOR SALE: Exceptionally 
clean 2 bedroom house. 
522.500.00 Call 272-4846 
tiller 7 p.nt.
S 13s 3tc

Very nice 2 bedroom, large 
den. brick home. Located 
502 Smith. Across the 
street from school. Sudan. 
Texas. Y32.500.00 Call 
Lubbock. 806 792-5650 al­
ter 6 p in. during week.
8 IK Kic

FOR SALE
Property in Marble Falls, 
Texas. Ready to move into. 
Call owner at 2723514

J.B. SUDDERTH 
REALTY INC.

Box 627 
109 Fifth St. 

Farwell, Texas 79325 
Phone [806] 481-3288 

or 481-9149

60 Acres west of Mule- 
shoe on highway. One 6 
inch well, side - roll 
sprinkler. Steel buil­
ding. 2 sets of nice 
improvements.

160 acres northwest of 
Muleshoe, 2 wells, lays 
good on FM highway.

8-49s-tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
bedroom brick. 704 W.
1 »•<’. K. Owner is licensed 
real estate broker. Call 
272 5483.
8 12l-6lp

HOUSE FOR SALE 
2441 sq. ft. of living area 
with 3 bedrooms, 2 bath­
rooms. living room, den 
with fireplace, game room, 
kitchen with all built-in 
appliances: storage house 
with 120 sq. ft.. 2 ear 
garage, central heat and 
refrigerated a/c. 1903 W. 
Avenue G. across the 
street from the elementary 
school. Call 806-272-3764 
after 6 p.m. and one week­
ends.
8-14s-4lc

1.440 acres more or less. 
Southeast part of Parmer 
County on FM 214 on 
Running Water Draw. 7 
miles southeast of Bovina. 
5250'acre. Jones Appraisal 
Farm and Ranch. B.L. 
lones. Jr.. Broker |<W6| 
799-5040 or 795-6359.
8 I4s-6tc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom. 2 
bath house, brick. 1850 
sq.ft. Very good location. 
272-5487 before 5 p.m.. 
272-5170 after 5 p.m.
8 lls-lfc

HIOHWAV >14 NOMM

TOWN and
j COUNTRY
RE AL  ESTATE

,  . -M l - 1 -C - t l
JO H N W. SM ITH, ! '< * « '

8 0 6  2 7 2 -4 6 7 8  o r  2 7 2 -3 7 2 5

Large brick home. 3 
bedrooms. 2 baths, 
central heat, kitchen & 
den. drapes go. Has it's 
own water well and lots 
of concrete. $64,000.00.

Brick home has 3 bed­
rooms. 2 baths. 2 car 
garage. Good location. 
$55,000.

Large home has 3 bed- 
riHims. 2 baths, living- 
room, dinning room and 
den. Franklin fireplace, 
refrigerated air. Good 
buy $39,990.

Stucco house has 3 
bedrooms. 2 baths, new 
paint inside and out and 
new carpel. $27 500.

Nice 3 bedroom. 2 bath 
h <ine on 1 acres, lias 
well and storm cellar, 
with sheds and fences. 
I miles NE or Muleshoe 
*r 8 miles NW of folk 
Si.11ion. X 10.000 
8 I ?i tfe

For all your real estate  
ne eds  cal):

GLAZE *  GOFORTH - 
112 A v e . C  
272-4208

& ± U l£ _________________

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE 

232 Main 272-4838 
Joe and Ricky 

Smallwood

323 W. Ave. E. 3 bed- 
roont. 2 bath, living 
r«H>m. kitchen and 
dining area.

Large duplex. 913 and 
915 East Fir. Each unit 
has 2 bedrooms. 2 bath, 
living room and den. 
Small down payment

We need listings. 
See or call Joe or Ricky. 
8-4t-tfc

REID
REAL ESTATE 

We want your business 
"Remember"

Reid Real Estate 
Henry C. Reid. Broker 
U>l I W. American Blvd 

272-3142 or 272-5512 
Richland Hills -  3 bed­
room. 2 bill brick, cent. 
VV.H. iSc has its own 
water well. $<>4,000.

Cute 2-1. with carport 
tnd fenced yard. Priced 
to sell.

Large 3-2V4-I, Cent. A 
and H. plus fireplace.

High School Area 
l arge 3-1 3/4-2. brick 
home. Cent. A&H

Excellent Rental Pro­
perty - 2-2 bdrm. units 

$17.000.

3 Bdrm.. I bill., stucco 
house - $7,000.

FARMS 
Bailey Co. - 395 ac.. 4 
wells. I circle. 500-600 
gpm water.

Parmer Co. - 320 ac.
1 10" & 1-8" well. 2 
circles. 29 percent down 
and 8 percent owner 
financing.

Bailey Co. - l<>0 ac..
2 8" well. I circle, lavs 
perfect.

Parmer Co. - 280 ac.. 
I 6" & 1-8" well. I 
circle. 2 siderolls. mod­
erate down & assume 
low interest loans.

George Nicman. man­
ager. Home 965-2488; 
fhursic Reid 272-3142; 
Di Mine Nicman. home 
>'»5 7188; and Lucille 
Harp, home 272-4693.
8 13s stfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom 
brick. Has lots of extras. 
1907 W Ave. G. 272-4701. 
8 I2s-lfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
bedroom brick. 904 W. 7th 
Call 272-4448 or 272-5483.
8 I2l-6tp

Krebbti Real Ettlate

*********•**•***•**#****•***'
14. FARM PROP. FOR LEASE

FOR RENT OR LEASE:
I(4) or 100 acres, with I 
well each. 5 miles east of 
Muleshoe on southside of 
llwv 70 Call 799 7342 af-
!>•! 6 p.m.
I I I 3s 3ie
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * , , , * , , * * *

HOUSEHOLD GOODS

Ranch style couch, makes a 
bed. new vinyl cover. Club 
chair new gold and black 
cover. Recliner - bcrculon 
and vim I cover. 118 W.

BURROWS
UPHOLSTERY AND 

FURNITURE REPAIR 
118 W. Ave.  C 

In the rear 
Phone 272-42SS 

12-39s-tfc

FOR SALE: Utility Bed. 2 
years old. Call 272-5634.
12-14t-2lc

10. FARM EQUIP. 
FOR SALE

6 rows Gandy insecticide 
spreaders. for Temik. 
Electric driven. extra 
motor.
Wylc Spray Rig: 200 gallon
lank. Hyd. pump. Call 
925-6766 nights.
10 9|-tfc

6 row John Deere Planter: 
7I Ilex with Acra-plants. 6 
row bed roller, row scral- 
cher and electric drive 
noble herbicide boxes 
mounted on a 21 ft. hanby 
double tool bar and guage 
wheel. Call 965-2619 after 
7:30 p.m.
10 I4t-2lc

11 - FOR SALE 
OR TRADE

FOR SALE: Small part 
lime business. Good op­
portunity for "extra” cash.
5 cents & 10 cents vending 
machines: 35 units. For 
more information. call 
272 3993 or 272-3994.
II 12s-tle

New 1981 18 ft. and 19 ft. 
Sea Arrows. Sec at Friona 
Boat Company at Re'eves 
Chevrolet. Olds in Friona. 
806-247-2774.
I l-3s-tfc

FOR SALE: Motorcycle - 
1977 Kawasaki KZ 1000. 
cruise, vet ter fairings, 
saddle bags and box. and 
custom seal. Call 385-4659 
alter 6 p.m. Roland Bell. 
Littlefield.
I I  l l s - l f c

FOR SALE: Portable color 
Catalina TV. Excellent 
condition. Call before 8 
a.m. or after 5 p.m. 
272-3778 or 272-4352.
II I4s-2te

Graphic Equalizer. 2 Jen­
son Tri-Axles speakers. 2 
Motorola Tri-Axle speakers
I Motorola 8 track AM-FM 
Siereo. Call 272-4762.
II 13t--4tc

FOR SAI F.: 2TV s: I - 25 
in. Zenith Chromaeolor 
Remote Control. 10 years 
old. $100. I - 17 in. B/W 
Phileo Pacer about 12 years 
old. $25. Both need some 
repair. 272-4174.
II 14t-2ic

15. MISCELLANEOUS

I 6’ X I4‘ enclosed metal 
trailer. Tandem axels and 
electric brakes. Nignls or 
weekends 965-2488 or
272 5403.
15 |I s  4tse

Lady Bcc at Earth is
now carrying
SCULPTRESS BRAS.
Call 252-3748.
IS-26s-stfc

Gage Construction 
Bob Gage

Specialize in Custom 
Fireplaces 

Phone 272-5240 
Or

272-5105
at Muleslwe

FOR IN S U R A N C E  CALL

F.L. NEWTON, Agtnt 
128 East 10th - Box 749 
Littlafiald, Tixat 79339 
Phone: Bui. 306 385-3055

Like a good neighbor, 
State Farm is there.

s r / c

State Fairn Insutante Companies 
HomeOHues Bloomington Illinois

Bruce
Construction
Electrical Wiring 

Repairs
Remodeling & 

Additions
Communication

Installations
272-4027

Want a propane system? 
Check with SMITH LP GAS 
MULESHOE.
15-30s-tfc

FRANKS 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICE 
PARTS & REPAIR 

315 W. 3rd Ph. 272-3822 
15-71 tfe

New prime pipe: Vi inch 
pipe - 25 cents per ft./ I 
inch pipe - 45 cents per ft.

2 inch pipe - 81 cents per 
ft. ' 1% inch pipe - reject - 
45 cents per ft./ I Vi inch 
pipe - reject - 53 cents per 
ft./ 10.000 ft. of 16 inch at 
.250 wall at $11.50 per ft. /
5 16 inch cable at 4% 
cents per ft./ 7/16 inch 
cabft^tt 6'/j cents per ft. 
Call Farwell Pipe and Iron 

481-3287.
15-11 s-8lc

16. LIVESTOCK
............................................
FOR SALE: Registered 
Nubian goals. 2 yr. old in 
milk first freshener. 7 yr. 
old star milker in milk; 7 
month old dolling by star 
buck. Several wethers for 
barbeque. More kids due 
in April HELP!! Call 272- 
1178.
16 I3s-3tc________________

Public Notice
The Trustees of the 

Muleshoe Independent 
School District will offer for 
sale bv scaled bid the 
following:

One 60 Passenger 1972 
1HC Chassis, Superior 
Body. School Bus.

Two 60 Passenger 1974 
IHC Chassis. Ward Body. 
School Buses.

These buses may be in­
spected at the school bus 
barn between 8:00 a.m. 
and 5:00 p.m. Monday 
through Friday.

Bids will be opened May 
II. 1981 at 8:00 p.m. The 
Board reserves the right to 
reject any and all bids in 
the best interest of the 
District.

Tom G. Jinks (S.)
Tom G. Jinks

Assistant Superintendent 
For Business

agri­
facts

By
Bill Wooley

If som eone  te lls  y o u  the 
scorcher of 1980 will be 
repeated in 2003 or 2026 . 
listen. Based o n  th e  th e o ry  o f 
tem pe ra tu re  and  p re c ip ita tio n  
cyc les  w h ic h  te n d  to  repea t 
them se lves  eve ry  23 years, 
w ith  ex tre m e  v a ria t io n s  eve ry  
46 years, the  reco rd  b re a ke r o f 
1980 w as  p re d ic te d  in A u g u s t 
. . .  o f 1934 The  c yc le s  are 
related, a c co rd in g  to  th e  
experts, to  v a ria tio n s  in th e  
rad ia ion  o u tp u t o f th e  sun  - 
w h ic h  a re  a lso  cyc lic a l. F o rty  
six yea rs  f ro m  the  h e ig h t o f  th e  
d ro u g h t o f 1934 leads to  1980. 
A c c o r d i n g  t o  l e a d i n g  
m e te o ro lo g is ts , the  re co rd - 
b re a k in g  d ro u g h t a c tu a lly  
began in 1979 and ended  w ith  
p re c ip ita tio n  sho rtages  in th e  
fa ll o f 1980 such  as M is s o u ri 
w ith  o n ly  19.77 inches  o f 
m o is tu re  by  O ctober 9 , 1980 
T h o u g h  th e  fa rm ers  m ay  n o t 
be to ta lly  a t the m e rcy  o f the  
w ra th s  o f natu re , th e y  are 
c e rta in ly  suscep tib le  to  the 
cyc les  o f na tu re

Wooley
International, Inc. 
Hwy, 84 Muleshoe

Ren1
0

Wosl.ers

No Service Expent

t-to-Own 
Dior TV

Dryers Refrigerators

\e No Interest To Pay 
a  tfeU )

, 117 MAIN s

ifoon
Appliance

4ULESHOE 272 5681

Front End Alignment

1 9 * *
Mott American A Import care, 
pickups '3 extra 
Here's whet we (to:
•Inspect front end pertt ‘ Adjust 
caster, camber and toe In to 
factory specifications •Whites 
safety check "Road test

103 Main

POYNOR’S WHITE STORE INC

You’re not ju st buying a  
sack at seed...

you’re buying yield, dependability and 
performance.

ORO G — This medium-season hybrid is designed for maximum  
gram production ir> areas where the greenbug is 'a  pest. Good 
standability under a variety of conditions -make this hybrid a good 
producer'under dryland or irrigated production.

You can depend on O RO  for yield and’dependability, it 's ‘ ‘ as g o o d

See your ORO dealer today!!

ORO A,

Seed 6 Grain Co.
624 27th Lubbock T« 79*04 (806)744 1408 

ts 'k o  Tx 78596 .(512)968-5506


