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“ Ole Coke County’ ’ To Be 
Presented July 23-24 and 30-31

Fascinating events of a past 
century will be recalled in Robert 
Lee the last two weekends in July 
when the fifth annual pageant, 
“ Ole Coke County, Home of the 
Rabbit Twisters,” will be presen­
ted in Mountain Creek Amphi-

Commissioner 
Court Has 
Two Meetings

The Coke County commission­
ers met Tuesday, July 6, because 
Monday was a holiday. General 
business was conducted:

Read and approved the min­
utes of the last meeting.

Confirmed appointment of 
Becky Mehaffey to Deputy 1.

Ratified Oil and Gas lease 
agreement concerning county 
school owned mineral properties 
in Cochran county. Attorney Bill 
Helwig had received the lease 
agreement, at the request of 
Judge Sims, and recommended 
ratification.

The court approved the request 
by General Telephone to bury a 
cable installation.

Commissioners voted to table 
further discussion of a senior 
citizen center until next week and 
review proposed sites.

It was voted to pay storage on 
cheese allocation.

. ,No action was taken on a 
resolution request by the city of 
Big Spring in support of U.S. 
Highway 87 as the interconnect­
ing interstate between existing 
east-west interstates.

Approved bills for payment 
and adjourned.

The second monthly meeting of 
the county commissioners court 
was held Monday, July 12. The 
reading of the minutes of the 
last meeting and approval was 
first item of business.

Commissioners tabled a dis­
cussion for East Coke County 
Ambulance Service assistance 
on paying insurance premiums 
until information could be obtai­
ned concerning assistance of the 
West Coke County Ambulance 
Service.

Reviewed and approved the 
county treasurer’s quarterly re­
port.

Republican Party representa­
tives Dusty Abbott and Yvonne 
Lloyd met with the court and 
presented a list of people’s 
names they want considered for 
election clerks at the November 
elections.

Commissioners voted not to 
apply for senior citizen center 
funding. Those voting against 
applicaton were commissioners 
Jerry Parker, Bobby Vaughn and 
Finis Millican. Commissioner 
George Newby voted to apply and 
Judge Sims cast his vote to apply, 
also.

Approval and payments of bills 
concluded the meeting.

Weekend guests, July 4, with 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Davis, were 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. P.B. 
Middlebrook of Anson and her 
brother and family, Nina, Tee, 
Tex. and Chantel Middlebrook, 
also of Anson. The families 
enjoyed a holiday of water skiing, 
golfing and outdoor cooking.

theatre, Robert Lee, Texas on 
July 23-24 and July 30-31.

Admission prices: Children, 
age five to twelve, $2.00. Adults, 
$4.00. Children under the age of 
five, admitted free. Busloads, 20 
or more persons, with reserva­
tions, will receive a 25% dis­
count. For further information, 
call 453-2831, Robert Lee, Texas.

Pre-performances begin with 
“ A Singin” from 8:00 to 8:30 
p.m. Production time is 8:30 
p.m.

“ Ole Coke County,” a musical 
pageant, depicts the colorful 
history of Coke County. It is 
performed by around one hun­
dred local and area citizens of all 
ages. From the opening scene, 
depicting an exciting and colorful 
1854 Indian Pow-Wow; Planning 
the Organization of the County; 
Conflicting Points of View of Free 
Rangers, Nesters, Ranchers; 
Rails through Bronte; to the 
closing of saloons in Coke County 
is West Texas history unfolding 
before your eyes.

A variety of food and soft 
drinks will be available at the 
concession stand.

Class Of 1951 
Gives $105 To 
School Ljbrary

The Class of 1951 of Robert Lee 
High School presented Elemen­
tary Principal, William Hood, a 
check in the amount of $105.00 to 
purchase books for the elemen­
tary school library. These books 
will be presented as a memorial 
to classmate Harriet Porter Ste­
vens who died May 19, 1982.

Harriet, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. H.B. Porter, of San Angelo, 
former Variety Store owners in 
Robert Lee, was married to Bill 
Stevens of San Antonio. They 
were parents of two sons and at 
the time of her death, Harriet 
was a first-grade teacher.

Contributions for the memorial 
fund were made by members of 
the 1951 class and faculty mem­
bers, Mrs. LaVerne (Darter) St­
ory of Abilene and Dr. and Mrs. 
Merlin Mitchell of Oronoco, Min­
nesota.

Singing Group 
To Return Here

‘“The Eternity Singers” are 
coming back! The well-known 
group of young musicians will 
return to Robert Lee for two 
performances on August 31.

Led by Rev. Joseph Alessi, the 
15 member professional singers 
and instrumentalists travel 
60,00 miles a year nation-wide 
and have covered several other 
countries. These Christian men 
and women are welcomed where 
ever they go.

This year they will be a 
community-sponsored event and 
Christian families are asked to 
open your homes to these visiting 
young people for "two days and 
nights. For more information call 
Barbara Jameson at 453-2939. 
Watch for more details at a later 
date.

Coke County Rodeo This 
Weekend In Bronte Arena

Plenty of live action and excite­
ment is expected over on the west 
side of the town of Bronte Friday 
and Sautrday nights when the 
Coke County Rodeo Association 
kicks off the annual Coke County 
Rodeo.

Performances begin each night 
at 7 o’clock in the Bronte Roping 
Arena.

A change of the date for the 
parade to Saturday afternoon at 5 
o’clock is for the benefit of the 
community. It is hoped that a 
large turnout of parade watchers 
will line the route. Everyone who 
has a horse to ride (bicvcle and

Local Boys Are 
Selected To 
All-Star Team

During closing ceremonies for 
the Winters Area Little League, 
three RL boys were named to the 
All Stars 1^82. Those named are 
Robert Runnion son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Arthur Runnion, Jason 
Herring son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Herring, and Raymond 
Hodnett son of Mrs. Roxie Hod- 
nettv It was an exciting moment 
for the boys and one well 
deserved. All Star play started 
Monday in Abilene with the boys 
taking the first game firom Jim 
Ned 4-0. The Tournament will 
last all week with teams from 
Winters, Jim Ned, Anson, Ballin­
ger, and Merkel. Head coach for 

the team is Tony Smith firom 
Robert Lee with Jerry Hood fiom 
Winters as assistant.

Dwayne Blair of San Angelo, 
son of Mrs. Dave King, is 
recuperating at his home from 
major back surgery two weeks 
ago. Mrs. King said he is making 
a good recovery.

stick horses, welcomed!) is invi­
ted to join the parade. The riders 
will gather at the old Sante Fe 
deport at 4:30 p.m., then ride to 
Bronte Nursing Home where the 
parade will form. The route goes 
up Highway 277 to Main Street, 
then turns west and continues to 
the depot.

A large number of events are 
scheduled for both boys and girls 
in all age groups. Events for all 
girls and the younger boys are: 
barrel racing, flag racing and 
pole bending. The older boys will 
compete in steer or bull riding. 
Tie-down, Break-away or ribbon 
roping.

Contestants are divided by age 
groups of six years and under 
through 19 years and over. The 
rule for eligibility for All-Around 
Awards will be in efiect again 
this year. The rule states there 
must be four or more contestants 
in your age group. Anyone

SILVER HOMECOMING 
SET FOR JULY 25

The Silver Homecoming and 
Reunion will be held this year on 
Sunday, July 25, announced Mrs. 
Eva Jo Millican. lunch will be 
served at 12:00 noon on that day 
at the Silver Baptist Church. The 
association will furnish meat, 
bread and drinks; those attend­
ing are asked to bring desserts 
and salads.

For more information, all Mrs. 
Millican at 453-2940.

wishing to move up to the next 
age group may.

Prizes will be awarded to the 
top four contestants in each 
event. O’Neill’s Western Wear 
of Winters has donated all prizes 
which will be belt buckles, first 
place; second, halters; third, 
head stalls and fourth curry 
combs. Donaho’s Saddle Shop of 
San Angelo will present the best 
all-around boy and girl with 
$25.00 gift certificates.

Admission prices to the rodeo 
will be $2.00 for adults and $1.00 
for all school age children.

A concession will be selling 
a lot of good food for those who 
would like to enjoy supper and 
rodeo fun at the same time. Hot 
dogs, sloppy Joes, sausage-on-a- 
stick, cold drinks and other 
goodies will be available.

Rodeo chairman for this year is 
Elton Millican of Robert Lee and 
the arena director is R.T. Thom 
of Bronte. Secretary of the 
association is Brendi Gentry of 
Bronte and if you want more 
information contact her by ph­
one, 786-4482.

RODEO ROYALTY
Jhe 1982 rodeo queens have 

been elected to reign over the 
rodeo activities. Senior Queen is 
Melanie Cooper, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Donald Cooper. Junior 
Rodeo Queen is Teresa vaugnn, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. James 
Vaughn.

Remember-Rodeo Time-7 
p.m., July 16 and 17, Bronte- 
Y’all Come!

Volunteer Ambulance News
The Ambulance has been real 

busy with 46 runs since getting 
our new unit.

We’re starting a “ Save A 
Baby” , program, something 
you’ll be hearing a lot about. The

Mt. Creek Golf Club Hosts Meet
The Father-Son, Son-in-law, or 

Daughter Tournament provided 
lots of family fun on the course 
last weekend. The two-day 

^ tourney was based on points 
- rather than scores and allowed a 

father to combine his totals with 
several of his family members if 
they wanted to. Frankie Percifull 
tallied with three of his family, 
while Calvin Sparks played with 
five relatives. Besides the nice 
family day, the tourney was good 
experience for all the young 
golfers.

Winning the Championship 
Flight with 197 points were 
Caudle and Caudle of Bronte. 
Johnny Ramirez and Jamie of 
San Angelo, second with 195, and 
Memo Valdez and Jr. Valdez of 
San Angelo in the #3 Spot at 191.

First Flight was taken bv 
Charles Adams and Craig of 
Midland, 166, second place, 
Johnny Ramirez and Jerome of 
San Angelo, 160, and Ivan Sl­
aughter and Jim of San Angelo 
she- a 155 for third.

T'le Second Flight was won by 
harles Vandiver and Rob of San 

Angelo, 153, Calvin Sparks and

Carla Walker second with 142, 
and third was close with a 140 by 
Calvin Sparks and Glenn Brid­
ges.

In the Third Flight, Robert 
Voyles and Bill Bums scored 126 
points, while a second place of 
122 went to Adam Trevino and 
Jr. Trevino of San Angelo. Two 
120 point scores tied for third; 
Wayne Turn and Jerry of San 
Angelo, and Calvin Sparks, and 
Bucky of Robert Lee.

A total of 69 players entered, 
although some played with more 
than one.

Local merchants and indivi­
duals donated trophies for the 
tournament.

The tournament committee ex­
tended their appreciation to the 
donors, to Carla Walker, club 
members Clarence Tinkler and 
Mike Davis for their assistance at 
the Club House, and others who 
helped with the meet.

A Junior Tournament is sche­
duled for Saturday, July 17, with 
tee-off at 8:00 a.m. It will include 
all juniors through high school 
but college students cannot en­
ter.

phrase means just what it says— 
learning to save a life that might 
otherwise be lost. Three baby 
deaths in San Angelo-so uncal­
led fpr-spurred the Fire Depart­
ment and Ambulance group to 
start teaching classes, teaching 
everyone to be able to save a life. 
We of the ambulance crew would 
like to extend to you a personal 
invitation to attend one of our 
August classes.

On our regular blood pressure 
clinic day, August 14, we will 
have classes from 10 a.m. to 1 
p.m. Again on the same day 
from 5-6 p.m., on Sunday, 
August 15, 2-4 p.m., and on 
Tuesday, August 17, fi‘om 7-9 
p.m., the teaching will continue. 
If you cannot attend any of these 
classes, call a volunteer member 
for special classes. Remember, 
they are free and anyone having 
the care of a small child, fiom 
teens to 100 need this training. 
Only 30 minutes of your time 
could be the difference between 
life and death for a baby in your 
family.

Also a reminder to look for­
ward to our big Barbecue coming 
up Labor Day. This is to be an 
annual event to keep our 
ambulance well stocked with 
up-to-date supplies and equip­
ment Tor Coke County. The next 
ambulance call could be for you.

Thanks for “ HELPING US 
HELP YOU” .

Nita Schnabel
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Mrs. Kenneth Goldunidi

Brenda Dennis, Mr. Goldsmith 
Exchange Vows June 26th

Wedding vows were exchan­
ged on Saturday morning, June 
26, at 11 o’clock in the Robert Lee 
Baptist Church by Brenda Den- 

Inis and Kenneth Goldsmith of 
Snyder.

The Rev. Roy Epperson, pastor 
of the church, officiated the 
ceremony.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mrs. Leatrice Dennis of Denver 
City and the late K.D. Dennis. 
The groom’s parents are Mrs. 
Betty Kincheloe and R.V. Gold­
smith both of Snyder.

The altar was decorated with 
an arch draped with fern and

greenery, accented by urns of 
fresh flowers in orange hues, 
while the bridal aisles were 
marked with coral ribbon bows.

Musical selections for the occa­
sion included “ Bridal Chorus’’, 
“ Always’’, “ A Wedding Song’’, 
and “ The Wedding March’’ of­
fered by Bob Taylor , vocalist, of 
San Angelo and Mrs. Gayle 
Bolding, pianist, of Robert Lee.

The bride, given in marriage 
by her brother, Ronald Dennis of 
Midland, wore a gown of candle­
light satin, organza and chantilly 
lace. The fitted bodice featured a 
scooped neckline, accented by

C O K E  C O U N T Y

I .

JULY 16 & 17
7:00 P.M.

BR ON TE ,  T E X A S

ELIGIBLE

CofhoKsiori Will Be Open

rows of chantilly lace. Adorning 
the waistline was a satin and lace 
ribbon forming a bow in the back. 
A shortened overskirt was cut to 
reveal a floorlength satin skirt 
with layers of chantilly lace, 
which lengthened to a chapel 
train.

The bride chose a candlelight 
picture hat, accented by appli­
ques and seed pearls circling the 
brim. The crown was covered 
with chantilly lace which fell into 
a long bow, tied with satin 
ribbons. *

A hand crocheted handker­
chief, belonging to the bride’s 
grandmother, was featured as 
the central interest in the cres­
cent-shaped bridal bouquet. 
Fresh flowers of bettina roses, 
orange enchantment lilies and 
aisteruemerias surrounded by 
baby’s brbath, moonlight lace, 
and pecot ribbon completed the 
bouquet.

To complete her ensemble, the 
bride wore a strand of pearls and 
diamond and pearl earrings, a 
gift from the bridegroom.

Bridal tradition was carried out 
with a six pence in each shoe, 
denoting the bride’s and groom’s 
birth year. The handkerchief 
from her grandmother served as 
something old, her dress, some­
thing new; something borrowed, 
a tiny gold bracelet from a friend; 
and she wore a blue garter.

Servins the bride as matron of 
honor was Paula Shields of Mor­
ton. Her gown was of coral 
crepe, fashioned with a ruffie 
edging a v-neckline and continu­
ing down the front of the dress. 
The waist was tied with a wide 
sash of self-fabric. Fresh flowers 
adorned her hair.

The groom was attired in a 
beige, three piece suit, comple­
mented by a dusty coral shirt 
with brown tie. His boutonniere 
was made up of a bettina rose 
and baby’s breath.

Attending the groom as best 
man was Gerald Claxtqh of 
Snyder. Servnig as ushers for the 
service were Johnny Claxton and 
Terry Franks, both of Snyder. 
They/Were clad in brown and tan 
suits.

Bree Ann Bolding of Robert 
Lee was flower girl for the 
ceremony. She wore a dress of 
coral crepe, featuring a round 
neckline, short pufr sleeves, and 
a full skirt with a deep ruffled 
edge, all accented by lace. A bow 
with ribbon streamers enhanced 
the back waistline. She wore a 
hairpiece of coral silk flowers and 
carried a small white basket of 
mixed flowers.

Dusty Dennis, Midland, the 
bride’s nephew, served as the 
ring bearer, carrying a heart- 
shaped satin pillow bordered by 
chantilly lace. He wore beige 
slacks, lace-trimmed beige shirt, 
and a coral satin vest with a bow 
tie.

Registering wedding guests in 
the vestibule of the church was 
Carla Goldsmith, sister of the 
groom.

The registry table was qovered 
with an off-white satin cloth and 
highlighted by the bride’s book 
and feathered pen.

The bride’s mother chose a 
peach two-piece shantung suit 
with off-white blouse and acces­
sories for her daughter’s wed­
ding. Her corsage was of bettina 
roses, baby’s breath and coral 
ribbon.

The mother of the groom wore 
a navy, fitted dress and jacket 
with white accessories for the 
occasion. She also wore a 
corsage of mixed flowers tied 
with pink ribbon.

As the bride approached the 
altar, she presented her mother 
with a long-stemmed rose. After 
the vows were solemnized, she 
presented a rose to the groom’s 
mother on leaving the church.

Speciarjl guests for the cere­
mony were Mrs. B.R. Rice,

grandmother of the bride and the 
groom’s grandmother, Mrs. R.E. 
Sharp.

A reception honoring the cou­
ple was held in the Fellowship 
Hall of the church following the 
wedding.

The bride’s table was covered 
by a lace cloth over a coral 
underlay. Crystal serving pieces 
held banana punch, nuts, and 
finger sandwiches. Centering the 
table was the four-tiered wedding 
cake decorated by coral roses. 
Wedding bells accented the top 
tier.

Presiding qver the bride’s ta­
ble were Susan Blassingame and 
Valerie Baker of San Angelo.

The groom’s table, covered by 
a lime-green linen cloth, held a 
chocolate cake complemented by 
chocolate roses and the names of 
the bride and groom. Cofree and 
cake were served to guests from a 
silver service and china plates by 
the sister of the groom, Leatha 
Stout.

A rehearsal dinner, hosted by 
the groom, was held on Friday 
evening in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. A.L. Braswell of Robert 
Lee.

For the couple’s wedding trip 
to Puerto Vailarta, Mexico, the 
bride chose a three peice coral 
linen suit, accented by ofr-white 
accessories, and a hairpiece of 
flowers.

The bride has been a teacher in 
Robert Lee School system. She 
graduated from Denver City High

School, Texas Tech University, 
and received her Masters Degree 
<̂ om A.S.U.

The groom graduated from 
Snyder High School ana anenaea 
Cisco Jr. College and Texas Tech 
University.

Following their honeymoon, 
the couple will be at home in 
Snyder where he is employed by 
Dynamic Fluids Control.

Bridal Courtesies
An engagement party honored 

the couple on April 14 in the 
home of Kay Grim in Robert Lee.

The home of Mrs. Paul Burns 
was the scene of a bridal shower 
on May 23 in Robert Lee.

A miscellaneous shower was 
held in the Fellowship Hall of the 
First Baptist Church of Denver 
City for the couple on June 9.

Mr. and Mrs. Jame Herford 
recently attended Mr. Herford’s 
family reunion at Anahuac, Tex­
as. On the way to the reunion, 
they visited in Longview with 
their son Ernest Herford and 
grandson Charlie. On their way 
home they visited with Mr. 
Herford’s brother and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. George Herford, at 
Sam Rayburn Lake.

THE MOUNTAIN CREEK 
GOLF CLUB

Extends their appreciation to the following 
merchants who donated trophies for the Father 
and Son and/or Son-In-Law, Daughter Tourna­
ment on Sunday:

IVEY MOTOR COMPANY  
W EST W A Y GROCERY 

WESTERN AUTO STORE 
HEART O’TEXAS SAVINGS ASSN. 

ALLEN INSURANCE AGENCY  
HORACESCOTT  

ROBERT LEE STATE BANK  
J&B LUMBER &  HARDW ARE CO.
SAN ANGELO PIPE & SUPPLY CO. 

M OUNTAIN CREEK LODGE 
TH E FLOWER SAK 

ADAMS LAND & REALTY CO.

O ne 11 X  14 C o lor  P o r tr a it  $ 1 .5 0
Your choice o f fa m ily  group or ind ividual 

One special o ffer per fa m ily . one per person

MOUNTAIN CREEK LODGE
Thursday July 22nd 

Photo Hours; 1:00 - 8:00 p.m.
B-3 ROBERT LEE, TX vw ,Ae KoooK pope> 

H«f090ooioo»
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Tamela Lots Tvbb

Tubb, Herr Engagement Told
Mr. and Mrs. Mack Tubb of 

Abilene announce the engage­
ment and approaching marriage 
of their daughter, Tamela Lois, of 
Corpus Christi, to David Herr,

Lisa Devon Is 
Honored At Tea

Miss Lisa Devoll, bride-elect of 
Greg Pearson, was honored on 
Tuesday, June 29, with a bridal 
tea in the home of Mrs. Dolores 
Roe.

Punch, coffee, and cookies 
were served to a number of 
guests. The serving table was 
highlighted by an arrangement of 
greenery and silk flowers in 
shades of orchid, covered by an 
off-white lace cloth, the table was 
accented by napkins and camUes 
in the bride’s chosen colors of 
orchid.

The honoree received a large 
number of lovely gifts, including 
a Food Center from the hostes­
ses.

Honored guests present were 
the mothers of the engaged 
couple, Mrs. Yvonne Devoll and 
Mrs. Sharon Pearson. Special 
out of town guests were the 
brides aunt and cousins of San 
Angelo, Mrs. Joyce Hood, Gina 
and Melinda.

Hostesses for the occasion 
were: Jerry Thomason, Dolores 
Roe, Evelyn Flanagan, Barbara 
Adkins, Mary Bessent, Dale 
Fields, June Gulley, Pat Brasuel, 
Melba Heck, Gay Sawyer, Fran­
kie Hood, Cindy Riley, Iris Con­
ner, Carolyn Casey, Susie Wil­
son, and Diane Hambright.

The couple will exchange vows 
on August 14 in the home of the 
bride-elect’s parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lendy Devoll.

Betty, E.B., and Steve Comp­
ton of Midland recently visited in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Pearson. They attended the 
wedding of Craig Pearson and 
Carolyn Eaves of Midland in San 
Angelo on June 26.

LIONS
CLUB

MEETING
1st & 3rd Tuesday 

of Each Month - 7 p.m.

LIONS CLUB CO M M UNITY  
CENTER

also of Corpus Christi. He is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Herr, 
Corpus Christi.

The wedding vows will be read 
in the home of the prospective 
groom’s parents at 3201 Topeka 
St. at 7:00 p.m. on Saturday, July 
17. The Rev. Stratter, a longtime 
friend of the family, will officiate 
the ceremony.
V Miss Tubb is the granddaugh­
ter of Mrs. Mary Tubb of Robert 
Lee and the late A.M. Tubb.

Local Man 
Is Killed In 
Auto Mishap

Max Lon Cole, 20, of Robert 
Lee, died at 10:50 p.m. Saturday, 
July 3, when his pickup truck ran 
off Farm Road 1904 and over­
turned 2.6 miles northwest of 
Robert Lee. Cole was pronoun­
ced dead at the scene by Peace 
Justice Opal Jacoby.

Services were held at 2 p.m. 
Tuesday, July 6, in Robert Lee 
Baptist Church with Rev. Roy 
Epperson officiating. Burial 
followed in Robert Lee Cemetery 
under the direction of Shaffer 
Funeral Home.

Max was bom Oct. 20, 1961 in 
Freona, Tx. He moved to Robert 
Lee at an early age, lived there 

until the age of 12, and returned 
to Freona, then returned to 
Robert Lee one year ago. He was 
employed by Gideon’s Sheet 
Metal and Air Conditioning.

Survivors are his mother Fran­
cis Cole of Robert Lee; his father 
Lawrence Cole of Sterling City; 
his stepmother Lucille Cole of 
Sterling City; three brothers, 
Andy of San Angelo, Cliff of San 
Angelo, Kent of Robert Lee; four 
sisters. Cherry Nail of Carlsbad, 
Kay Duerksen of Midland, Jodell 
Block of San Angelo , Patty 
Porter of San Angelo; his grand­
parents Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Cole 
of Farmwell, N.M.; and a grand­
mother Mrs. Irma Johnson of 
Robert Lee.

Pallbearers were Manuel Aba- 
los. Josh Rodriquez, Terry Pay­
ne, Ray Cruz, Eugene Gloria, and 
Santos Rodriquez.

Mrs. Ruth Watson is in Shan­
non Hospital in San Angelo 
recovering from extensive back 
surgery performed there on Mon­
day morning. Visiting with her 
this week is her niece, Nettie Bob 
Roberts of McLeon.

WORSHIP W ITH  US AT

Southside Church of Christ
BIBLE STUDY..10:00 a.m. EVENING WORSHIP.6 p.m.
WORSHIP........11:00 a.m. WED. BIBLE STUDY.7 p.m.

-THE FRIENDLY CHURCH- 
WHERE THE BIBLE IS TAUGHT

BEST MAID WAFFLE SYRUP qt. bot. $1.19
Chicken of the Sea Tuna 
Del Monte Light Sliced Peaches

Boneiess
Beef
Lb.

Bulk Sliced Bacon, by Dankworth 
GOOCH GERMAN SAUSAGE 
PARKAY OLEO, in Qtrs.

flat can 99c 
303 can 65c

lb. $1.59 
ring $1.49 

ib. 59c

Toilet Tissoe Hi Dri 
4 Roll Pkg.

HI DRI TOWELS ige. roll 59c
Generic (unbranded) Facial Tissues 200 ct. 49c 
Pinesol Originai Disinfectant 15oz. bot. $1.09

Gandys 
5 Qt. Bucket

Aunt Jemima Buckwheat Mix 1 lb. box 73c 
Sunbeam Cookies (reg. $1.09 pkg.) each 89c 
Sunbeam Vanilla Waffers, reg. 49c pkg. 3/$1

Shortening 
3 Lb. Can

DUNCAN HiNES CAKE M IX reg. box 99c 
HUNTS CATSUP 24 oz. bottle 99c
PUNCH DETERGENT giant box $1.39

Prices Effective July 16th & 17th___

West
Grocery

le ia  •  imsaoF raO M X 4ffS-2852
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Results Of Play Nights Given
Play Night a^vities at the 

Bronte Roping Arena got off to a 
late start this summer due to the 
thunderstorms and overly wet 
arena. To make up for lost time a 
Tuesday night performance was 
held July 6. The young cowboys 
and cowgirls were ready and 
eager to start t^e competition. 
Events and rider's placement 
follows:

6 and Under
Barrels: 1. Casey Thom; 2. 

Brandon Martin; Honorable men­
tion (HM) Jay Parker and Jake 
White.

Flags: 1. Casey Thom; 2. Jay- 
Parker; 3. Brandon Martin; 4. 
Jake White.

Poles: 1. Casey Thom; HM. 
Jay Pariter and Jake White. 

7-8 Year Olds
Barrels: 1. Cory Thom; 2. 

Melinda Gentry; 3. Donya Coop­
er; 4. Teresa Vaughn; 5. Tracie 
Mauldin; 6. Amiee Parker.

Flags: 1. Melinda Gentry; 2. 
Donya Cooper; 3. Cory Thom; 4. 
Amiee Parker; 5. Tracie Mauldin; 
6. Teresa Vaughn.

Poles: 1. Cory Thom; 2. Donya' 
Cooper and Amiee Parker; 3. 
Tracie Mauldin; HM. Teresa 
Vaughn and Melinda Gentry. 

10-12 Year olds
Barrels: 1. Pete Ensor; 2. Lisa 

Exam; 3. Shane Kelton.
Flags: 1. Pete ^nsor; 2. Lisa 

Ezum.
Poles: 1. Lisa Exum; 2. Pete 

Ensor; 3. Shane Kelton.
Nineteen years and over: 

Barrels, Flags, and Poles: Jana 
Ragsdale.

Saturday night, July 10, action 
and points began to add up as 
riders and horses worked as a 
team with these results:

6 Years and Under 
Barrels: 1. Casey Thom; 2. 

Brandon Martin; 3. Cindy Carl­
ton; HM. Jake White.

Flags: 1. Casey Thom; 2. 
Brandon Martin; 3. Jake White; 
4. Johnathan McCutchen; HM. 
Cindy Ckrlton.

Poles: 1. Casey Thom; 2.

Coke 4-H Dress 
Revue Is Held

The Cckt County 4-H Fashion 
Revue was held July 9, on the 
ConrdKWsc lawn.

Beginners in the contest were 
Dorinda Scott, Kim Hood, Steph­
anie Rogers, Michele P a ^ ,  Tin! 
Hines, Christy Sowell, and Misti 
Taylor.

Nikki Epperson, DeAnn Parker 
and Brenda Ellis entered the 
intermediate division.

Girts representing Coke Coun­
ty at the District Fashion Revue 
in Abilene, July 27, are: Begin­
ner Division; Michele Partner, 
Intermediate Division; Nikki Ep­
person, Senior Division; Melanie 
Epperson.

Mike Richards 
Visits In R-Lee

Brandon Martin; 3. Johnathan 
McCutchen, HM. Jake White 
and Cindy Carlton.

7-9 Year Olds
Barrels: 1. Cory Thorn; 2. 

Amy Bloodworth; 3. Melinda 
Gentry; HM. Darla Scott.

Flags: 1. Melinda Gentry; 2. 
Amy Bloodworth; 3. Cory Thorn.

Poles: 1. Melinda Gentry; 2. 
Amy Bloodworth; HM. Cory Th­
om.

10-12 Year Olds 
Barrels: 1. Lori Bloodworth; 2. 

Lisa Exum; 3. Ron Carlton; 4. 
Raymond Hodnett; 5. Pete En­
sor; 6. Dorinda Scott.

Flags: 1. Pete Ensor; 2. Ron 
Carlton; 3. Lisa Exum; 4. Lori 
Bloodworth; S. Raymond Hod­
nett; HM. Dorinda Scott.

Poles: 1. Pete Ensor; 2. Lem 
Bloodwor^; 3. Lisa Exum; 4. Ron 
Carlton; 5. Raymond Hodnett; 
HM. Dorinda Scott.

13-15 Year Olds 
Barrels: 1. Patty Bloodworth; 

HM. Pam Sharpes.
Flags: 1. Patty Bloodworth; 2. 

Pam Sharpes.
Poles: 1. Patty Bloodworth; 2. 

Pam Sharpes.

- NOW AVAILABLE -
In Our Store While You Wait

COTTON T-SHIRTS
Different Styles 
Assorted Colors 

Solid and Two-Colored

We Do Iron-On Transfers 
Many Choices - Pictures, Letters, 

Numbers, etc.

H.S. L. TAYLOR CO.
121 N. State (Highway 277) Phone 473-7321

Open Monday-Friday 8-5 - - Saturday 9:30-5:30

Mike Richards, candidate for 
state comptroller, was in Robert 
Lee last week. Accompanied by 
his wife, Cyhthia, and aide, 
James Sears, Richards attended 
a local meeting arranged by 
Dusty Abbott and Yvonne Lloyd, 
members of the Coke County 
Republican Party steering com­
mittee.

To brighten aluminum uten­
sils, place this solution in them: 
two tablespoons cream of tarter 
for each quart of water they hold. 
Boil five to ten minutes, says 
Bonnie Piemot, family resource 
management specialist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension
iftv lce . U* ^

Public Notice
Southwestern Bell, in accordance with the rules 

of the Public Utility Commission of Texas, hereby 
gives notice of the company’s intent to implement 
a new schedule of telephone rates in Texas, effec­
tive July 27,1982, unless otherwise determined by 
the Commission.

It is expected that the requested rate schedule 
will furnish a 13.4 percent increase In the com­
pany’s intrastate revenues.

A complete copy of the new rate schedule is on 
file with the Public Utility Cornmlssion at Austin, 
Texas, and with each affected municipality served 
by Southwestern Bell, and is available for inspec­
tion In each of the company’s public business 
offices in Texas. The Commission staff has con­
tended in the past that ail rates are subject to 
change as a result of Southwestern Bell’s rate 
application.

Notice to El Paso Area Customers

Effective January 1, 1982, Southwestern Beil 
adopted the Mountain States tariffs in effect for Ei 
Paso County. Southwestern Beil proposes to 
merge the separate Ei Paso tariffs with its tariffs 
applicable to the rest of Texas. The resulting new 
rate schedule is on file with the PUC and the El 
Paso area municipalities served by Southwestern 
Bell, and is available for inspection at our El Paso 
business office.

Notice to Customers of 
Other Telephone Companies

The filing includes,, but is not limited to, propos­
als to increase rates for interexchange private line 
and foreign exchange (FX) service. Changes in 
such rates-would also affect customers of other 
telephone companies because such companies 
provide Interexchange private line and foreign ex­
change service in accordance with rates specified 
in Southwestern Bell’s tariffs. While Southwestern 
Bell has proposed no increase in long distance 
rates, any change in those rates would also affect 
customers of othdr telephone companies.

Aviso Publico
Southwestern Bell, en conformidad a las reglas 

del Public Utility Commission (Comisibn de Servi- 
cios Publicos) de Texas, por la presente hace 
saber su intencibn de establecer un nuevo arancel 
para servicio de telefbno en Texas con vigencia a 
partir de! 27 de julio, 1982, a menos que la Comi- 
sibn haga otra determinacibn.

Se espera que el nuevo arancel que se ha soli- 
citado rendira un aumento de 13.4 por ciento en 
los ingresos intraestatales de la compariia.

Una copia completa del nue^o arancel se ha 
archivado en las oficinas del Public Utility Com­
mission en Austin, Texas, al igual que en cada 
municipalidad afectiada y servida por Southwest­
ern Bell, y cada una de las oficinas de la compariia 
para negocios con el publico en Texas tiene una 
copia para lectura publica. En el pasado, la Comi- 
sibn ha sostenido que toda tarifa estb sujeta a 
camblos que resuiten de la manera en la cual 
Southwestern Bell aplique sus tarifas.

Aviso a Ciientes ên la Region de Ei Paso

Con vigencia a partir del 1o de enero de 1982, 
Southwestern Beil ha adoptado las tarifas de 
Mountain States efectivais en ei condado de Ei 
Paso. Southwestern Bell propone unir las tarifas 
de El Paso con sus otras tarifas que se apiican al 
resto de Texas. El nuevo arancel que resulta de 
bsta union se ha archivado en la Comisibn de 
Servicios Publicos (Public Utility Commission), al 
igual que en las municipaiidades de la regibn de El 
Paso servidas por Southwestern Bell, y estb dis- 
ponible para inspeccibn publica en nuestras ofici­
nas de El Paso.

Aviso a los Ciientes de 
Otras Compariias de Telbfono

El registro incluye, pero no se limita a, propues- 
tas para aumentar las tarifas para servicio de linea 
privada entre centrales telefbnicas (interex­
change private line) y servicio de central telefbni- 
ca extranjera (foreign exchange FX). Cambios en 
dichas tarifas de servicio tambien afectarian a 
ciientes de otras compariias__de telbfono porque 
dichas compariias proveen los servicios ya men- 
cionados en conformidad a tarifas especificadas 
por Southwestern Bell. Aunque Southwestern Bell 
no ha propuesto un aumento en las tarifas para 
larga distancia, cuaiquier cambio en las. mismas 
tambien afectaria a los ciientes de otras com­
pariias de telbfono.

Southwestern Bell

m m



M n. Terry Poehle

Miss Davis, M r. Poehis Repeat 
Vows in Garden Ceremony

Donna Kaye Davis of Wingate 
and Terry Kent Poehis of! Winters 
exchanged wedding vows on 
Wednesday evening, July 7, at 
7:00 p.m. in the garden at the 
home of the bride’s parents.

Mr. and Mrs. Edwin G. “ But­
ch” Davis of San Angelo are the 
bride’s parents. The groom is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Poehis of Robert Lee. '

The double ring ceremony was 
performed in a garden setting by 
the Rev. N.T. Gault of Miles.

The bridd, given in marriage 
by her father, wore a full-length 
white gown of organza, featuring 
an off-shoulder neckline, circled 
by lace and a soft double ruffle of 
self fabric. The skirt and short 
chapel train were accented by 
lace and seed pearls. She chose a

halo wreath of flowers for her 
hair and carried a bridal bouquet 
of mixed flowers.

Attending the couple were 
Kristy Andrews of Austin as 
matron of honor and Donald 
Saunders of Blackwell as best 
man.

The bride’s attendant was 
attired in a yellow sftreet-length 
sundress and carrield a mixed 
floral bouquet.

Stephanie Poehis of Robert Lee 
and Carrie Davis of $an Angelo, 
sisters of the bridal <^uple, were 
flower girls for the service.

Providiqg the wedding music 
was Sherrill Davis of Abilene, 
cousin of the bride.

Barry Davis, brother of the 
bride, ushered the wedding 
guests.

DR. PHILIP C. RAY 
General Dentistry

announces the change of office days in 
Robert Lee to Tuesday and Thursday 

by appointment.

Office-453-2618 
Hom e-453-2986

-NOW OPEN- 
STARLING’S GARAGE

Located at Intersection of Highways 158 &  208 
Robert Lee, Texas

- W e Work On All Vehicles - 
Also Make Service Calls On Farm Equipment

Hours 8 a.m .-5 p.m., Monday Through Friday

Quisenberrv’s Green House
408 E. 7th St. OpeirlOtUe Phone 453-2428

ROBERT LEE; TEXAS

- SALE -
Vt Price on Caladiums in 6 Inch Pots, Petunia baskets and 
Other Assorted Baskets.

Gloxinia In Bloom -$5.00 _i n

A reception in the home, 
honored the couple following the 
ceremony. Serving in the house- 
party was Lana Poehis of Robert 
Lee, sister of the groom and 
Melisa Poehis.

Following a wedding trip to 
Cozumel, Mexico, the couple will 
be at home^ear Winters.

Mrs. Poehis is a graduate of 
Angelo State University and is 
presently a teacher in Wingate.

The bridegroom is a Tarleton 
State University graduate and is 
self-employed.

Coke Countains 
To Appear 
On Television

Three members of the “ Ole 
Coke County” Pageant cast will 
be seen next week on two area 
television stations. The group 
will be interviewed by KCTV on 
Monday, July 19, at 5:00 p.m. on 
the “ Pat Attebery Show” , then 
on Wednesday, July 21 at 11:00 
a.m., they may be seen on 
KRBC-TV on “ Mid-Day With 
Kaye” .

Lucile Bryan will show slides 
taken at the Mountain Creek 
Amphitheatre and of new equip­
ment. She will also have a 
question and answer spot on the 
shows. “ Old-Timer” Don Mas­
ters of Bronte will give back­
ground on the pageant and lend a 
“ folksy”  air while Kitten Lemons 
of Weatherford will bring the 
musical’s theme song to TV for 
the first time with her voice and 
guitar.
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Appraisal Board 
To Meet July 21

The Appraisal Review Board 
for the Coke County Appraisal 
District will convene at 8:30 a.m. 
on Wednesday, July 21, 1982 at 
the Appraisal Office, 710 Austin

St., Robert Lee, Texas, for the 
purpose of reviewing local pro­
perties. Any persons having 
business with the Board are 
invited to make an appointment 
to appear before the Board. 
Board members are Ed Cumbie, 
Jack Cervenka, and Fred Mc­
Cabe, Jr.

G I G A N T I C

25% to 50% OFF 
SUMMER MERCHANDISE

Upon request of our.customers, we are having 
another SIDEW ALK SALE. Come by Friday, 
July 16, or Saturday, July 17, to see our great 
bargains.

The Clothesline

115W. Main 
Bronte, Texas

9:30-5:30 Mon.-Sat. 
Phone 473-7791

J SELF-CONTROL CAN BE 
THE SMARTEST THING 

YOU DO THIS SUMMER...

p90

•8 5

: 80  ̂1

r 75

i  70

Self-control can be the smartest thing you do this summer. Sometimes 
you have to cut down on the things you like, that takes self-control. Self- 

> control is important .When :you overindulge in too many calories. . . .  or 
when you over cool your home, It can be rough on your pocketbook if you 
set your thermostat too low bn hot summer days. WTU recommends set­
ting your thermostat at 78 degrees or higher. Clean or replace your air 
conditioner filter at least once a month so your unit will operate as effi­
ciently as possible.

Stop by your WTU local office today, and 
pick up your FREE copy of “ Make your 
Home More Energy Efficient” you’ll be glad 
you did. . . .

W EST TEXAS UTIUTIES COM PANY

IJ ̂  3 11;

A M ember of T he C e n tra l and  S outh  W est System

Remember, WTU Supplies the Energy, but only You Can Use it Wisely!
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CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING 
RATES

1st Insertion---- Per Word 10c
($1.50 Minimum)

2nd and Subsequent
Insertions___Per Word 7c

($1.00 Minimum) 
Additional 50c for Blind Ads 
Cards of Thanks .. Same Rates 
Legal Notices---- Same Rates

COPY DEADLINE
Class. A d s---- 4 p.m. Tuesday
Display Ads . . .  4 p.m. Tuesday

HOUSE FOR SALE- Solid built 3 
bedroom, 2 bath; bricked, with 
central heat and air. 453-2277

31-TNC

MILLER LIQUID FEED Service 
James Miller, 473-7271. ■

46-tfc-BP

PIANO TUNING AND REPAIR, 
30 years experience. Phone Ben 
G. Arnold, 453-2361, Robert Lee.

13-tnc

MOORE DIRT CONTRACTOR. 
Bronte, Tex. Phone 473-3474. We 
do caliche and dirt work, septic 
systems, road building, repair 
and new. 24-tfc-BP

FOR SALE- large 4 bedroom 2 
bath home, carpeted throughout, 
on 2 comer lots. 453-2720, Robert 
Lee. BP-46-tnc

I DO SAW SHARPENING of all 
kinds. B.F. Elkins - C|01453-2789 
Robert Lee, Tx. 33-TN

AMWAY PRODUCTS come to 
you satisfaction guaranteed or 
your money back. June Gulley, 
453-2848. ' 17-TNC

LOT FOR RENT with hook-up for 
trailer. Call 453-2785. 52-4tp

WOULD YOU LIKE TO LOSE 
WEIGHT-the nutritious, deli­
cious way? Come to Thrif-Tee 
Furniture and gift shop or call 
453-2084 after 5, or come by 1021 
Bishop St. Robert Lee. 2-4tcbp

IN BRONTE FOUR BEDROOM 
house, 2 baths, large rooms, 
huge kitchen, shop, horse pens 
on seven lots, fruit trees. Best 
deal in town--under $40,000. 
iiown payment required, owner 
will finance balance. Bob Shi­
elds, 415 Highway 277, 473-5721. 
______________________ 3tpbp

FOR SALE - 15 ft. Lam-Pro ski 
boat with 115 HP Evinrude 
motor, tri-hull with walk-thru 
windshield, canopy and coyer. 
Good condition. 453-2395. 52-4tc

SAVE $4.00
CAR WASH, CHANGE OIL 

(5 Qts. Ford Oil), and 
FILTER CHANGE

Reg. Price $23.80 
NOW $19.80

Unusually muddy or vehi­
cles with road tar - Extra 
Charge.

IVEY MOTOR CO.

Political
Announcements

ROBERT LEE OBSERVER Jl

FOR SALE - 1600 sq. ft. home, 2 
bedroom, carpeted throughout, 
central heat and air-conditioning, 
on 2 lots. 453-2541 or 453-2005 
after 5:30 p.m.

BP-45-3tp

The Observer has been au­
thorized to announce the candi­
dacy of persons listed below for 

. the offices and in the elections 
indicated:

SPARKS WATER WELL SER­
VICE, Windmill and Pump Work. 
Prompt service. 653-9311.

42-TNC

NOVEMBER
GENERAL
ELECTION

ALL BREED DOG GROOMING 
and small breed boarding, rea­
sonable prices. 453-2810

44-tnc

For Congress, 17th District-
CHARLES STENHOLM

For County Judge— 
AUBREY DENMAN

, Classified ads and Cards of 
Thanks are payable in Advance 
unless customer carries a regular 
account.

FOR SALE BBQing sized goats. 
Call 473-7264.__________ 3tcbp

For County and District Clerk-
MRS. ETTIE HUBBARD

For County Treasurer—
MRS. JERRY THOMASON

GILLEYS DUMP TRUCK SER­
VICE- 12 yd truck. Local Hauling 
Robert Lee-Bronte area. Call 
453-5621. BP-48tnc

NEED A CAKE? Wedding, 
birthday, etc. Will cater wed­
dings and anniversaries. Call 
Sharon Pitcocki 453-2038. 49-4tp

Mr. and Mrs. H.G. White 
announce that the marriage 
of their daughter, Mary 
Kay, to Craig Bessent, 
which was scheduled for 
July 16, will not take place.

WE WILL buUd fence. 453-2281. 
___________  S3-2tp

WE NEED DEALERS, for stand- 
up cookbook. Free details. 
Weist Publishing Company (S 
Main St.) Dept. S. POB 164 
I Englewood, Ohio 45322._____^

FOR SALE

3 bedroom frame house, located 
on 100 ft. lot.
A 14x65 Mobile Home, 3 bed­
rooms, 2 baths, located on 4 lots,
2 patios with porches, storm 
cellar, 3 sheds.
3 bedroom house, 2 full baths, 
1,400 sq. ft. total electric. 
Located on large comer lot. 
Spacious 3 bedroom brick house, 
1982 sq. ftr, with double carport, 
well landscaped, country living ' 
with city conveniences, located 
on 2.071 acres in Town View 
Estates, have to see to appre- 

'ciate.
ADAMS LAND A REALTY CO.

Phone 453-2723 or 453-2721 
or

655-9429

GARAGE SALE: Start 8 a.m. 
Friday and Saturday. 301 S.E. 
Railroad. Ixrts of good items. 

I Bronte. 29-ltpbp

GET IT WHILE it’s hot (the 
weather). Coastal Bermuda Hay, 
excellent quality. Some very 
good hay grazer hay. Now 
baling. The Hayri^ Valley 
Ranch, 473-6052, Bronte. 
____________________ 29-ltcbp

CUSTOM HAY BALING-Arch 
Mathers, Call 453-2035 or 453- 
2903. 2-4tc

NOTICE
Applications are being accepted 
at East Coke County Nursing 
Home, Bronte, Texas for Doc­
tor’s Office-Clinic. Receptionist- 
Insurance Clerk and Office LVN 
Nurse. Salaries dependent upon 
experience. PLease apply Mon. 
Fri. from 9-5 at Administrator’s 
office. Equal Opportunity Em­
ployer^_______  2tbp

OWN YOUR OWN Jean-Sports­
wear, Infant-Preteen or Ladies 
Apparel Store. Offering all 
nationally known brands such as 
Jordache, Chic, Lee, Levi, Van­
derbilt, Calvin Klein, Wrangler, 
over 200 other brands. $7,900 to 
$16^00 includes beginning in­
ventory, airfare for one to Fash­
ion Center, training, fixtures, 
grand opening promotions. Call 
Mr. Loughlin (612( 835-1304. 
___  2-ltp

FOR SALE-’76 Dodge Ram- 
Charger, good condition, AM- 
FM cassette, green in color. 
$2,895.00. Call 453-2504. 2-2tc

HOUSE FOR SALE-3 bedroom, 2 
baths, brick, 1300 sq. ft., fully 
carpeted. Call 453-2504. 2-2tc

BEAUTIFUL, used, large stereo 
unit, wood cabinet. Also a 
Panasonic stereo system. 453- 
2084 or 1021 Bishop St. after 
5:00. 2-ltc.

FOR SALE-14 shank John Deere, 
3 point chisel plow, $1250.00, 14 
ft. Moline Tandem Disc, $575.00, 
3 point New Holland Big Bale 
carrier, used 1 yr., $150.00. Call 
Don Mauldin, 453-2567. 2-ltc

CUSTOM HOMES 
AND REMODELING 

FHA-VA or Conventional 
653-6361 San Angelo

HOUSE FOR SALE-extra nice 3 
bedroom brick, 2 bath, living, 
dining, den, ceiling fans, built-in 
appliances, drapes, new carpet, 
all electric. Insured title. 305 
n th  St. 453-2506. 2-ltp

FOR SALE-queen-size sleeper 
sofa, GE washer and dryer, large 
evaporative cooler, all in good 
condign. 453-2012. 2-ltp

PUBLISHED EVERY FRIDAY EXCEPT W EEK OF JULY 4 and 
WEEK AFTER CHRISTMAS

(USPS 467-480)

Phone453-2433 - P.O.Box 127

Entered at the Post Office at Robert Lee, Texas 76945 as second 
class matter.

FOR RENT-2-bedroom furnished 
trailer, washer and dryer. 453- 
2352. 2-ltc

CARD OF THANKS
With deepest gratitude, we ex­
tend our appreciation to everyone 
for their prayers, food, visits, 
flowers and other acts of sym­
pathy during our loss. Thank 
you. Dr. Zeon, nurses, and 
Ambulance Service for your spe­
cial care.

Jo Ann Harrison 
Carlos and Ruby Rabb 

2-ltc

5-FAMlLY GARAGE SALE-Fri. 
and Sat. 9 a.m. until ? Kitchen 
appliances, bicycles, furniture, 
CB’s, old dishes, baby acces­
sories, also baby, children, ma­
ternity, and adult clothes. 319 
Zero St. 2-ltc

Thrif-Tee Fumitate A  Gift Shop 
next to WTU in Rob«»t Lee.
___ ____________2-4tcbp

INTERNATIONAL SWATHER, 
14 ft. header, setf-propelled, 
good oonditkm. Will sell for 
$6,500. faiquiie at First National 
Bsdik, Bnmte, or call Mick, 
473-2911 or 473-2691 after 5 p.m. 
____________________ 29-ltd)p

Jk jLJkW W S
u v m w m t.j

Texas DaparlnMnt of Public Safsty

PUBLIC NOTICE

Lone Star Gas Company, in accordance with Sec­
tion 43(a) of Article 1446c V.A.T.C.S., hereby gives 
notice of the Company’s intent to implement a new 
schedule of rates including a cost of service adjust­
ment clause for natural gas service to be charged to 
the residential and commercial consumers in the
City of Robert Lee, Texas 
effective July 16, 1982.

The rate schedule is expected to furnish a 
15.91 percent increase in the Company’s rev­
enues from residential and commercial customers in 
the City of Robert Lee, Texas

A Staternent of Intent has been filed with the City 
of Robert L e % n d  is available for inspection at 
the Company’s business office located at
111 West Twohig Street,
San Angelo, Texas.

I lone star Gas Company

Nervous
About

% ? Investing?

AZ-1

W e don’t blam e you one bit. To  
survive during these troubled  
times, safety for your m oney was 
never m ore im portant.

Insist that your savings are  
insured. They  will be w hen you  
see this em blem .

Each depositor insured to $100,000

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION

ROBERT LEE STATE BANK
Box 47 Robert Lee, Texas
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Services Held 
For Mr. White

Funeral services were held on 
Tuesday at 3:00 p.m. for Freddie 
Claus White, 62, in the Robert 
Lee Baptist Church, officiated by 
the Rev. Roy Epperson. Masonic 
graveside rites were conducted, 
followed by burial in the Robert 
Lee Cemetery.

Mr. White died on Sunday 
night, July 11, at his home in 
Robert Lee.

He was born on December 30, 
1919 in Wowata,' Oklahoma to 
Pearl Young and Jess White. 
The family moved to Arkansas 
when he was 10 years old, then 
on to Texas.

Mr. White was married to 
Wavoline Mattison on March 12, 
1939, in Texarkana, Arkansas. 
They resided in Louisiana for 14 
years and moved to Robert Lee 
IbVa years ago.

He was a Navy World War II 
veteran, a member of the Baptist 
Church, Robert Lce-Silver Lions 
Club, and the Hayrick Masonic 
Lodge # 696. A long-time 
employee of Sun Oil Company, 
he was plant foreman for Sun Gas 
Company in Silver at the time of 
his death.

Survivors include his wife, 
Wavoline, of the home; one 
daughter, Mary Harmon of Tul­
sa, Oklahoma; two sons, Fred 
White of Alice, and Bobby White 
of Plano; two sisters. Jewel 
Waters, of Texarkana, Arkansas, 
and Ella Mae Flirty of Oklahoma, 
City, Oklahoma; three brothers, 
Harley White of Jefferson, Way­
ne White of Austin, Louisiana, 
and Orville White, Robert Lee; 
and six grandchildren. He was 
preceded in death by one bro­
ther.

Pallbearers for the services 
were Jack Denman, Raymon 
Westbrook, Mike Post, Maurice 
Yarbrough, Mo Cheatham, Mau­
rice Duncan, Gene Baker, and 
Ernest Clendennen.

Dave Kings 
Enjoy Trip

Mr. and Mrs. Dave King have 
returned home after spending a 
month traveling in the northeast 
United States, while visiting their 
children.

They left Robert Lee on June 
11 for Arlington where they 
enjoyed several days with their 
daughter and husband, Madell 
and Jim Thomas. The couple 
then flew from Dallas to Colum­
bus, Ohio to see another daugh­
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. Dan 
Hall, Judy and Dana.

The King’s spent about 2 
weeks seeing points of interest in 
that area. Some of the things 
they especially enjoyed were 
Niagra Falls, the Amish commu­
nities of Ohio, a cheese factory, 
and a 2-day trip into Canada. 
They al?o toured the University 
in Columbus where their son-in- 
law works.

The couple stated they saw 
some beautiful country, espe­
cially the huge trees and the 
gardens of flowers.

Mr. and Mrs. King flew back 
to Dallas on July 6 and spent 
several days in the home of their 
daughter and husband, Eunice 
and Royce Wilkerson of Irving 
before coming home.

Mrs. King commented “ the 
pastures and yards have really 
gotten green and grown up while 
we were away.’’ They also had a 
surprise on their ranch near 
Edith when they drove down a 
normally dry pasture road and 
found the lake had risen to cover 
it. The lake, now at its highest 
level, will later take even more of 
their grazing land as it rises

LOOK WHCyS NEW
Mr. and Mrs. Grahame Fenton 

of Prairie Hill are the proud 
parents of their second son, Lane 
Wheeler, born on June 25. He 
arrived at Shannon Hospital in 
San Angelo, weighing 9 lb. 4 oz. 
and was 21V4 inches long. His 
brother, Travis, is four years old.

Grandparents are Mrs. Jerry 
Arledge of Sanco and Mr. and 
Mrs. H.L. Fenton of Woy Woy, 
Australia.

A  MJkW ¥ im  
A l t  u y m w t T H

Louise Gaston 
Services Held

Funeral services for Louise 
Caston, 60, of Odessa were held 
Monday at 3 p.m. in Easterling- 
Wilson Ft^neral Home Chapel 
with Rabbi Stephen Wiesberg of 
Lubbock officiating.

Mrs. Caston died Thursday at 
St. Luke’s Hospital in San An­
tonio after a lengthy illness.

She was bom March 4, 1922 in 
Horabech, La. She moved to 
Robert Lee and lived here in 
1962-63 and had lived in Odessa 
the past 12 years.

She is survived by her husband 
Clem Caston of Odessa and a son 
Lonnie Coats of Carylss, La.; and 
four grandchildren.

Attending the funeral from 
Robert Lee were Mrs. Bessie 
Caston, Mr. and Mrs. Carlton 
Caston and Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Harmon.
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Harrison Rites 
Held July 8th

Masonic graveside services 
were held on Thursday, July 8, at 
2 p.m., for Joe Eugene Harrison, 
in the Robert Lee Cemetery. The 
Rev. John Reynolds of McAllen 
was the officiant.

Mr. Harrison, 76, died in St. 
John’s Hospital in San Angelo on 
Tuesday, July 6, after a long 
illness.

He was born April 4, 1906 in 
Springfield, Missouri, moved 
with his parents, Mary Smith and 

Joseph Harrison, to Broken Bow, 
Oklahoma at an early age, where 
he grew up. As a young man, he 
moved to California and later 

entered the United States Army to 
serve during World War II. After

his discharge, on returning to 
California, he became engaged in 
contruction work, becoming a 
contractor.

Mr. Harrison was married to 
his wife, Jo Ann, in Reno, 
Nevada in 1963. On his retir­
ement in 1978, the couple moved 
to Robert Lee.

He was a Baptist and a 
member of the Buena Park 
Masonic Lodge #357.

He is survived by his wife Jo 
Ann of Robert Lee.

Mrs. Marilyn Smith and Jes­
sica of Stephenville spent 
week with het parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.C. Wallace. While in 
Robert Lee, she visited her 
grandparents, Mrs. Horace Blo- 
odworth of Silver, Mr. and Mrs. 
Calvin Wallace, and other rela­
tives.

CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDITION
(including Domestic Subsidiaries)

LEGAL TITLE OF BANK

Robert Lee State Bank
CITY COUNTY STATE ZIP CODE

Robert Lee Coke Texas 76945
STATE BANK NO. FEDERAL RESERVE DiST. NO. CLOSE OF BUSINESS DATE

1684 1 1 ._ J June 30. 1982
ASSETS
1. Cash and due from banks........................................................ .. ......... .
2. Due from other depositories and all cash items in the process of collection.............
3. U.S. Treasury securities.................................................. .........................
4. Obligations of other U.S. Governrr>ent agencies and corporations...... ..........
5. Obligations of States and political subdivisions in the United States.....................
6. All other securities.......................•..........................................................
7. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell....... .
8. Total loans (including overdrafts totaling $ 1 M _____ __) (From Schedule A, Item 8)
9. Lease financing receivables........ .......... , ...............................  ..............

10. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises ..
s.11. Real estate..,Qwned ofher tha rj^a iirym ^n i^^o . .

12/ Letters of credit and customer? fiabifity on'acceplarices outstanding
13. All other asse ts .......................................
14. TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 13)

LIABj^LITl^
15. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations.... ...........
16. Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations.....
17. Deposits of United States Government....................  ........................
18. Deposits of States and political gubdivisions in the United States..............
19. Due to b ank s.......... ..................  ̂ .................................... ........
20. All other deposits .....N.. Q.. .W-... 1064.............. l.l.GAccounts..... .
21. Certified and officers’ checks............. ,....................................  ......
22. Total Deposits (sum of items 15 thru 21 )..............................................

a. Total demand deposits................. ............................................
b. Total time and savings deposits..... ...................................... ........

23. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase
24. Interest-bearing demand notes issued to the U.S. Treasury and

other liabilities for borrowed money.................... ............................
Mortgage indebtedness for which the bank is directly liable.....................
Unearned discount on loan s.......... ......  , .......................................
Letters of credit and acceptances outstanding.................................. ..
All other liabilities....... •.............................................. .................. ‘

Mil. Thou
-L

Nnnp

None

15

None

11

I k
860-489

None
None

25.
26.
27.
28.
29.
30.
31.

None

TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) (sum of items 22 thru 28)
Subordinated notes and debentures.................................................................................................
Allowance for possible loan and investment lo sse s .....................................................................

.QQQ_ -)
CAPITAL

32. Common stock (No. of shares outstanding 10.
33. Certified su rp lu s ....................................... ........................... ...........................
34. Undivided p ro fits ...................... ..................... ...................................................
35. Uncertified surplus, reserve for contingencies, and other capital reserves
36. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 32 thru 35) ..........................................
37. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 29, 30, 31 and 36).

NoneNone
-1A

Nonp

15

iiao .

J50.
261
i n .
55:441
.̂23-
127

78
794

.520.
I2Q.54
539
073
42

145-

A3fL

A h l .

Jk3L

T D tr
300
795

~T5-
240
794

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8 
9

10
11
12
13
14

15
16
17
18
19
20 
21 
22 
22a 
22b
23

24
25
26
27
28 
29,
30
31

32
33
34
35
36
37

NOTE; This report must be signed by an authorized officer and attested by not less than three directors other than the officer signing the report.

I. the undersigned officer, do hereby declare that this Report of Condition (including the supporting schedules) has been prepared in conformance with the in­
structions and is true to th? best of my knowledge and belief.

SIGNATURE OF OFFICER AUTHORIZED TO SIGN REPORT ' AREA CODE/TELEPHONE NO. DATE SIGNED

915-453-2545 7-13-82
NAME AND TITLE OF OFFl'CER AUTHORIZED TO SIGN REPORT

Willis Wayne Smith Vice President ____ CashjLei:_

W e the undersigned directors, attest the correctness of this Report of Con­
dition (including the supporting schedules) and declare that it has been ex­
amined by us and to the best of our knowledge and belief has been pre­
pared in conformance with the instructions and is true and correct.

SIGNATURE OF DIRECTOR

(MAKE MARK FOR 
NOTARY’S SEAL)

Stale ot
Sworn to and subsdribed 

My commission expires___ notary Public.
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LaVonda WlUlains and Douglas Herford

Miss Williams, Douglas Herford 
To Exchange Vows August 21

The Robert Lee Baptist Church 
will be the setting for the August 
21, 7:00 p.m., wedding of LaVon- 
da Williams and Douglas Her­
ford. Parents of the prospective 
bride are Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey 
Williams of San Angelo. 
prospective groom’s parents are

Herfords Host 
SampleReunion

Mr. and Mrs. James Herford of 
Robert Lee.

Miss Williams is a graduate of 
Magnolia High School and is an 
August candidate for graduation 
at Angf^o State University.
' Her fiance is a Robert Lee High 
School graduate, a graduate of 
Cisco Jr. College, and atten­
ded ASU. He is employed by Sun 
Gas Company.

Mr. and Mrs. James Herford 
hosted over the July 4 weekend a 
reunion of Mrs. Herford’s family, 
descendants of the late Reverend 
Eugene Alexander Sample and 
Lucy Day Sample.

Mrs. Herford’s brothers and 
their families attending were Mr. 
and Mrs. Jasper Sample of 
Houston, Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Sample of Knott, and James 
Sample of Ruidoso, New Mexico.

Sisters and their families at- 
tendinff were Mrs. Clara Drake of. 
Ozark, Arkansas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Hughy Fettus of Tuscola and 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Laborda of 
Thousand Oaks, California.

One sister, Mrs. Raymond 
Haynes and Mr. Haynes, of 
Yukon, Oklahoma, and one sis­
ter-in-law, Mrs. James Sample, 
were unable to attend.

Other relatives attending were 
Mrs. Loy Stockton, Steve and 
Diedra, of Tuscola. Dr. and Mrs. 
Mack McCoulskey, Jeff and Mar­

go, of Mertzon, Mr. and Mrs. 
Arlis McCoulskey and LaVonda 
Williams of San Angelo and 
Doug Herford.

MYF TO SPONSOR 
HAMBURGER LUNCHEON

The MYF of the First United 
Methodist Church will sponsor a 
hamburger luncheon following 
the morning worship service on 
Sunday, July 18.

To be held at 12:15 p.m. in the 
Fellowship Hall the group will 
serve grilled burgers with home­
made desserts.

Donations will benefit youth 
mission work. The public is 
invited to attend.

Mrs. Marie Hester has been a 
patient in St. John’s Hospital in 
San Angelo since Thursday, July 
8. She is reported to be much 
improved, suffering from a chest 
ailment, and expects to return 
home this week.

Mrs. lone Raymond and Mr. 
and Mrs. David Estep of Houston 
were recent guests in the home of 
Mrs. Raymond’s parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mitchel Davis and other 
relatives.

WE INVITE YOU
TO BE WITH US FOR WORSHIP AND STUDY 

AT ALL THESE SERVICES

SUNDAYS: 10 a.m. and 6 p.m. - WEDNESDAYS: 7:30 p.m.

NORTHSIPE CHURCH OF CHRJST
CLYDE DUKES, Minister

Phone 453-2375 
CHADBOURNE AND W. 9th 

ROBERT LEE, TEXAS

Maryland Club 
Lb. Can

Veg-AII Mix Vegetables, 303 Can 
Del Monte Tomato Sauce, 8 oz. can

2 for 89c 
2 for 55c

Musselman Cherry Pie Filler No. 2 Can $1.59

Salmon Honey Boy Pink 
No. 1 Can $2.09

Armour Treet Spiced Luncheon Meat $1.45
Best Maid Waffle Syrup 32 oz. bottle $1.19

Corn Kits 2 for 47c
Northern Bathroom Tissue 
DAWN LIQUID 
BOLD DETERGENT

4rollpkg. $1.23 
22 oz. bottle $1.19 

giant box $1.99

OLEO Parkay 
Stick-Lb. 59c

LITE FLUFF BISCUITS 2 for 47c

Ice Creani Gandys
Pure

V2 Gal. Ctn

BANQUET POT PIES each 39c

Banquet 
20 Oz. Size

Idaho Russet

LEMONS, Sunkist 165 4 for 59c 
Chuck Blade Cut

ROAST
Lb.-

SEVEN BONE ROAST lb. $1.39
BONELESS ROUND BONE ROAST lb. $1.59 
ARMOUR TURKEY FRANKS 12oz. pkg.83c 
SLICED SLAB BACON lb. $1.69
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