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Citizens gather for Heritage Building opening
By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

A near capacity crowd of 
former and present teachers, 
students and administrators ga­
thered in the Ozona High School 
Auditorium for the official open­
ing of the Ozona Heritage School 
at 3:00 p.m. Sunday.

The 89 member high school 
band under direction of Kelly 
Glaze and assistant director Eric 
Wharton opened the one and 
one-half hour program. The 
band provided an interesting, 
well done repertoire of music. 
Songs played included: Entry of 
the Centurions, We Got the Beat, 
Sloop John B featuring Michael 
Glaze on the trombone; a percus­
sion ensemble. Grandfather's 
Clock, featuring Shawna Newton, 
Chantal Pessoh, Billy Aycock, 
Mark Sellers, Danny Guitterez, 
and Joe Perez; I ’m so Excited, 
and the school song. The Trio to 
the March, Our Director.

United Methodist minister. 
Rev. Ken Harrison, then gave the 
invocation. “ We are grateful as 
we celebrate this school open­
ing,” Rev. Harrison said. “ It is 
part of our heritage... We all cling 
to our history...that which sup­
ports us...The past and the future 
are combined, and the future is 
made secure.”

Superintendent of Schools Gar­
land Davis, who served as master 
of ceremonies, then introduced 
Jeffrey Sutton, president of the 
Ozona School Board of Trustees. 
Davis commended the board, 
saying, “This board is dedicated 
to having the best schools 
possible in Crockett County.”

Sutton then welcomed every­
one present on behalf of the 
“ board, administration, faculty 
and students. This will meet the 
needs of classroom space and is 
something Ozona is proud of.”

Sutton recognized former and 
present board members and 
Davis, as well -as the board

members’ wives. Those presently 
on the board include Gary 
Mitchell, vice-president; Cecil 
Buckner, secretary-treasurer; 
George Ybarra, Van Miller, 
Henry Sellers and immediate 
past president Joe Couch. Also 
recognized was Terry Lee who 
was a member of the board 
during much of the renovation.

“The board is very proud of 
this building and believes it will 
stand the test of time. It will 
serve our youth for generations to 
come,” Sutton said.

Davis then extended greetings 
and appreciation to those who 
assisted in the renovation project. 
“ My secretary. Baby Harrison, 
saw that anything I was to do was 
done...she spurred me to do it.” 
The school board wives were 
again cited for their contribution. 
“They held many meals while 
board members met into the 
night on school business.” He 
also recognized his wife. Rose 
Marie Davis.

The Crockett County Society 
and the Crockett County Com­
mission were thanked for pro­
viding the picture display from 
the museum at the Heritage 
School opening. Student Council 
and National Honor Society mem­
bers were recognized for their 
role in serving as tour guides of 
the building. Davis thanked 
Curtis Keith and his crew for 
cleaning and readying the build­
ing.

Davis then officially turned the 
building over to Ozona High 
School Principal Jim Payne. “ He 
inherits the responsibility for the 
building,” said Davis.

Various classes were then 
recognized by Davis. Bascomb 
Cox and R. A. Harrell were 
recognized in the audience as 
having been members of classes 
the first year the building was 
opened in 1912. Members of the

last graduating class, the Class of 
1931, were recognized, as well as 
those teachers, administrators 
and students who attended the 
building from 1912-31.

Teachers presently having 
classes in the building were then 
named by Davis. They include: 
Mrs. Judy Sims, cosmetology; H. 
O. Hoover and Gene Hood, math; 
Debbie Arrott and Thomas 
DeHoyos, English; Jacquelyn 
Shacklette, journalism; David 
Porter, speech and drama; Brent 
Scott, art; and Lane Scott, com­
puter science.

Mrs. Geniece Childress, chair­
man of the Crockett County 
Historical Commission, said the 
Heritage Building was a “ ful­
fillment of our purpose -- preser­
vation. It will be used by those 
who are nearest to our hearts, the 
young people of Crockett 
County.”

Brock Jones, president of the 
Crockett County Historical So­
ciety, said the building would be 
“ a great gift to the community. 
This project took much hard work 
and courage. Our historical heri­
tage will instill a sense of pride in 
the present.”

Mrs. Lucile Harrell, vice-chair­
man of the Crockett County 
Historical Commission, pre­
sented an award for historical 
preservation to the Crockett 
County School. The Texas Award 
for Historical Preservation, 
signed by George Christian, 
Texas State Historical Com­
mission, and Gov. Mark White, 
signifies that the building has 
met very specific historical 
preservation guidelines. The 
award was accepted by School 
Board President Jeffrey Sutton.

A teacher and coach in the 
school for many years, Ted 
White, then entertained the 
crowd with humorous tales of 
“The Building That Was” . White

took much of his information 
about the early history from his 
wife, Jessie White’s, master 
thesis, “ Early History of Edu­
cation in Crockett County” .

“ I wondered why they didn’t 
get an older person to speak,” 
quipped the 80 year old White, 
“ but I guess they probably 
couldn’t find anyone older.”

White reviewed the early years 
prior to 1912 of education in 
Ozona. The first school was held 
in a tent. By 1911, Ozona had 
“ growing pains” , and Judge 
Charles Davidson urged citizens 
to build a new school. Oscar 
Ruffini, a famous architect from 
San Angelo, was contracted to 
draw the plans for the building. 
Walter Kyle, using a hammer, 
chisel and other simple tools, and 
Ruff Everett did much of the 
actual work on the building pro­
ject. The rock came frorh the bluff 
behind where the school was 
erected.

Judge Davidson and the citi­
zens voted $85,000 in long term 
bonds to finance the project. “ He 
did not want the citizens of his 
day to have to pay for the 
building. Judge Davidson was 
content to let future generations 
pay for the construction,” White 
said. Only $75,000 of the bonds 
were issued.

Among the early graduates of 
the school were the Class of 1913: 
Joe Davidson, Nan Davidson and 
Forest Dudley.

Early superintendents of the 
school included J. B. Smith, from 
1911,-19; C. C- Minatra, Claude S. 
Denham and John L. Bishop who 
served from 1928-34. “ Bishop 
brought me here in 1931 from 
Sonora,” White said.

Among those attending the 
ceremony were L. B. T. Sikes and 
Roy Killingsworth of San Angelo. 
Sikes is a former superintendent 
and Killingsworth a former prin­

cipal in the Ozona School System.

Ron Barbutti, the architect for 
the renovation project, then 
spoke on “The Building That Is” . 
He described the tunnels under­
neath the building which origi­

offices and classrooms. The top 
floor, the least accessible, has the 
computer, speech and drama and 
art rooms.

The historical aspects of the 
building were provided by many 
trips to Austin. “ We refurbished,

Ted White spoke on “The Building That was”.

nally provided a cool draft in the 
building. “ These underground 
air wells were the first solar air 
conditioning system. The tunnels 
now house the new air condition­
ing system, which has individual 
room control units.

Two questions had to be 
answered when we started the 
project three years ago. Was the 
facility worth renovating? and 
could it handle the children and 
their needs? The building was 
structurally sound and had much 
useful space. There wa no reason 
to tear it down, Barbutti con­
cluded.

Cosmetology was placed on the 
basement level to provide easy 
access to the public who would be 
using the facility, Barbutti said. 
The middle floor is composed of

retained and enhanced...the 
building. The galvanized roof is 
the same as the original roof’. 
Heavier glass to repelí hail was 
used in the windows. One hard 
wood floor in the art room 
remains.

“ The things saved are ob­
viously old, while those things 
that are new are obviously new. A 
new lower ceiling houses new 
lighting and air conditioning 
systems.

Davis concluded the program 
by saying “ Some things still need 
to be done, and some things still 
need corrected.”

The audience then followed the 
Honor Society and Student 
Council members over to the 
building for a tour and reception. 
Refreshments were provided by 
the wives of school board mem­
bers.

Services held for M rs. Beulah Baggett Water, road equipment are court topics
Mrs. Early (Beulah Kay) Bag­

gett died at 11:30 p.m. Friday, 
September 20, 1985, in Crockett 
County Hospital. She was 94.

Funeral services were held at 
10 a.m. Monday, September 23, 
1985, in Ozona United Methodist 
Church with Rev. Ken Harrison 
officiating. Interment followed in 
Cedar Hill Cemetery under di­
rection of Sizemore Funeral 
Home.

She was born July 5, 1891 to 
the late Mr. and Mrs. James E. 
Kay in Navarro County near 
Dawson.

The family came to Crockett 
County when Mrs. Baggett was

11 years old. She married Early 
Baggett December 22, 1909 in 
San Angelo. She was preceded in 
death by her husband on October 
21, 1978. They had ranched 12 
miles south of Ozona since their 
marriage.

She was a member of Ozona 
United Methodist Church and a 
charter member of the Friday 
Bridge Club and the Pioneer 
Dance Club.

She is remembered by friends 
and loved ones for her intricate 
handwork and delicious candies.

Serving as pallbearers were 
Jack Baggett Jr., Dan Davidson, 
Mike Clayton, Doyle Lovell, Erby

Changler, J. M. Dudley Jr. and 
Charles Williams.

Honorary pallbearers were 
Wayne West, W. R. Baggett Jr. 
Tom Davidson, J. S. Pierce III, 
W. D. Cooper, Marshall Mont­
gomery, R. A. Harrell and J. C. 
Montgomery.

Attending from out of town 
were Mrs. Mel Brown, Ft. 
Worth; Betty Moore, Dallas; 
Mrs. Hiram Brown, Mrs. Elton 
Smith, Mrs. Beulah Pace, Austin; 
Willie V. Baggett, Kerville; Early 
Davidson, Houston; Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Hagelstein, Mr. and 
Mrs. Martin Baze, Fort Stockton; 
Mr. and Mrs. Pierce Miller, San 
Angelo.

Lions fall to Big Lake By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

“The Stanton Buffaloes will 
only outweight the Ozona Lions 
by a 20 pound per man margin as 
opposed to the 40 pound dif­
ferential we had against the 
Reagan County Owls,” Ozona 
Lions’ Head (Toach Jim Green 
said this week. Reagan County 
defeated Ozona by a 21-6 margin 
during the first home game for 
the Lions Friday.

Stanton will have a good ball 
team. The Buffaloes come into 
the Friday home game with a 1-2 
record. Stanton defeated Tahoka 
20-6 in their opener, but lost 8-6 
to Coahoma and 35-6 to Crane 
this last week.

The Lions were defeated this 
last week, but “ it was not for our 
lack of effort,” said Green. 
“ ‘Many Lions fans have com­
mented on the sincere effort of 
everyone on the team.”

During the game, three were 
injured. David Adams was 
knocked unconscious at the 8:51 
point of the third quarter. Adams 
was taken to Crodeett County 
memorial after the game with ̂ a, 
concussion. Though Adams* is 
“ doing fine, he will not work out 
until he is in good condition

according to both the trainer and 
his doctor.” He may not see 
action against Stanton. A de­
cision regarding his playing 
against Stanton will be made 
later in the week. Green said. 
Bias Vargas received a sprained 
ankle in the first half, but played 
in the second half. Sam High­
tower sprained an elbow, but also 
returned to the game.

Following the opening kickoff, 
the Owls started their first drive 
on the 32 yard line. The Owls 
were penalized five yards on the 
first play from scrimmage. Bias 
Vargas and Valdo Galindo pres­
sured Owls’ Quarterback Bobby 
Gunnels. The first three passes 
by the Owls were incomplete, and 
Reagan County then attempted to 
punt.

The Lions got the ball in 
excellent field position on the Owl 
10 yard line following a blocked 
punt. The two play scoring drive 
was capped by a three yard run 
by Chuy Hernandez at the 10:14 
point of the first quarter.

The Owls received the ball on 
Their 41 yard line, and marched 
down to the Lions’ 12 yard line. 
Harvey Fierro recovered a fumble

with 7:47 left in the first quarter 
to stop the Owls’ second drive.

Ozona was unable to move the 
ball and punted to the Owls, who 
took over on the Lions’ 42 yard 
line. The Owls capped the 42 yard 
scoring drive with a 27 yard pass 
from Gunnels to Scott Tipsey. 
The PAT by Robert Saldibir put 
the Owls ahead 7-6 with 3:57 left 
in the first quarter.

The next few possessions were 
stopped either by fumbles or the 
inability of the teams to sustain a 
drive. Valdo Galindo recovered a 
fumble by the Owls with 9:09 left 
in the second quarter. The Lions 
were unable to move the ball and 
kicked to the Owls.

The Owls started their second 
quarter scoring drive on the Lion 
38 yard line. Gunnels scored on a 
six yard run with 4:57 left in the 
half.

The Owls led at the half by a
13-6 margin.

Following the entertaining 
halftime show by Ozona High 
School Band, the large crowd 
watched a defensive standoff in 
the third quarter, with neither 
team scoring. Harvey Fierro 
thwarted a scoring march by Big

Ozona residents with flooding 
problems were represented both 
in person and by petition at a 
called meeting of Commissioners 
Court September 19. A request to 
be put on the one item agenda 
was granted after the previous 
week’s rains caused flooding in 
some parts of town. The meeting 
had been called solely to consider 
equipment purchases for the 
County Road Department.

Jerry Hill, spokesman for 
homeowners in the northeast part 
of town, told commissioners 
“ We’re getting washed away 
over there” . Hill showed the 
court several photos taken at 
problem points while water was 
running during the rain. The 
drive-across to Crockett County 
National Bank on First Street was 
one of the problem points. Hill 
said.

Judge Fields assured the 18 
citizens present that the water 
problem was not new. “ We’re 
not engineers...we understand 
your problem and we’re going to 
solve it,” said Fields. “ We’ll 
come up with some plan as soon

as we can;
Commissioners seemed to 

think that a good solution would 
be to take care of the water 
problems before they reach town. 
Plans were made to contact the 
local Soil Conservation office and 
Texas Highway Department to 
help in an analysis of the 
problem.

Judge Fields announced that 
he had received a petition from 
residents in the south part of 
town asking relief from water 
drainage problems. Part of the 
petition included a donation of 
land to the county for construc­
tion of a water gap from Santa 
Rosa St. down Bias Street.

After hearing from residents 
with water problems, the court 
reviewed a 'list of equipment 
requests from County Road Su­
pervisor Eddie Moore. Com­
missioners approved letting for 
bids two 1986 one ton trucks, cab 
and chassis and one 1986 
one-half ton pickup.

They also agreed to purchase a 
used 150 barrel water transport

tanker and a low boy trailer to 
carry fuel tanks.

Purchase of a new stove for the 
hospital was okayed.

Judge Fields informed listen­
ers that the coils and compressor^ 
on the air conditioner which 4 
serves the courtroom, had gone-* 
out the day before.

No air conditioning and win­
dows which had been painted 
shut combined to bring about a 
rapidly moving meeting.

Lake with a third quarter inter­
ception in the end zone. Butch 
Gonzales also recovered a fumble 
late in the third quarter.

Big Lake Owl Tim Tatum re­
covered a Lion fumble early in the 
last quarter. A Lion penalty gave 
the Owls the ball at the Lion 
27-yard line. Robert Saldibar 
scored on a 30 yard end around 
rush at the 8:24 mark of the 
fourth quarter. Gunnels ran into 
the end zone for the two point

s t a t is t ic s

conversion. This ended the 
scoring for the night.

Green said he was encouraged 
by the passing of Lion Quarter­
back Steve Sanchez. Sam High­
tower, David Adams, and Valdo 
Galindo had a strong offensive 
game.

The entire defense did an 
outstanding job. Green said. Bret 
Thompson, Harvey Fierro, Bias 
Vargas and Butch Gonzales “ rose 
to the occasion” .

OZONA
8
28 yds-36 carries
63 yds-4 passes
91 yds
14-4-1
8-34.6
4-1
8-70

First Downs 
Rushing Yards 
Passing Yards 
Total Yards 
Pass-Comp-Int 
Punts-Average 
Fumbles Lost 
Penalties-Yards

BIG LAKE 
17
181 yds-35 carries 
108 yds-5 passes 
289 yds
15-5-2 
3-15.6
5- 3
6- 40

Woody Phillips killed this 5 
foot rattler last week on the V. 
I. Pierce Ranch. The snake had 
five rattles and a button.
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Pandale Pannings
by Jonny Johnson

Campers, fishermen and 
ifunters were taking advantage of 
ijie nice weather this weekend in 
ijie Pandale area.

Ted and Jessie White cele- 
I^ated their 80th and 79th 
birthdays Saturday, September 

with barbecue and fixings at 
ttie Pandale Church with a host of 
biends.

McBride from Alpine killed a 
rCialé . mountain lion on Larry 
^rledge’̂s ranch September 19. It 
weighed 142 pounds.
*tM att Cavness’ life was 
fGrobably saved by a pair of 
ebwboy boots. He usually wear 
^nnis shoes. He was standing by 
¿T rock and looked down and a

copperhead was striking his boot.
Darren Grimm, Okey and 

Vivian’s son of San Antonio, and 
their nephew, Chet Blagg of 
Missouri, visited the Grimms 
over the weekend.

I was told that the pipe line was 
finished.

Everyone was upset over the 
big fight being scrambled on 
HBO on the satellite.

The pictures I have seen of the 
terrible earth quake that Mexico 
suffered last week were devas­
tating.

Quote: Larry Arledge said it it 
had been trying too hard, it ain’t 
gonna rain no moe! Unquote.

This 142 pound mountain lion was killed on the Larry Arledge 
Ranch. The cat was estmated to be four years old.

Ozona J V faUs 28-7

B7th grade wins debut 14-0

I grade overpowers Owls
*<Ĵ '.Copie Davis and T. C. Tucker

Thursday night, the seventh 
jdid .eighth grade Cubs traveled 
tô Big Lake. For the seventh 
g -̂ade, it was the first game of 
tfieir careers. They were full of 
eiithusiasm as they entered the 
contest. They used that emotion 

better Big Lake 14-0.
was surprised we scored 

twicp,”  said Coach Don Payne. 
;tl feel we played well. Our 
ifefdnse played exceptionally 
well.”
-*̂ The Cubs’ first score came late 
ifl[ the first quarter when Mingo 
Dominquez scrambled 35 yeards 
oti a'reverse. The PAT failed, but 
tke Cubs led 6-0.
^;;Great defense stymied Big 
lake’s offensé, allowing only 24 
yards total offense, causing the 
Owls to give up the football and 
givéThe Cubs numerous chances 
to, score. The Cubs did just that in 
tbe>fourth quarter, ending the 
second half stalemate that kept 
tbe;’score at 6-0, when Martin 
Qfbino carried the ball for a one 
yîirti T.D. The play was set up 
after Danny DeHoyos recovered 
ail ;0wl fumble. The two point 
conversion wa successful, making 
the score 14-0, Ozona. The final 
seconds soon ticked off the clock, 
gîying the seventh grade Cubs a 
vlçtory for their season opener. 
;tThe Cubs moved the ball 
intpressively, totaling 65 yards 
pa;ssing, credited to quarterback 
Oscar Gutirrez. And 57 yards 
rushing off the heels of Mingo 
Dominquez’s 24 yard per- 
forniance.
,*pefensively Jason Vitella man- 
a ^ d  six tackles, followed by 
Eonhie ÎVÎartinez and Albert Tala- 
raehtez, each with four tackles. 
'Diere were numerous Cubs who 
had one tackle each. 
lOzona’s eighth grade football 

team is living up to every pre­
season expectation tabbed on 
them. Two weeks ago, the Cubs 
throttled Greenwood 39-0. Last 
Weok, Ozona took its budding 
pSiiwêrhouse to Big Lake where 
thelCubs blasted the Owls 35-0. 
#j“,The first half was actually a 

tie,’; said Coach Payne, “ In the 
second half, they finally just sat 
back. I feel we were in better 
shape and wanted the game more

than they did.’’
The Cubs’ first T.D. came on a 

forty yard aerial strike from Chris 
Denman to Philip Munoz. Lalo 
Rodriquez faked the PAT and hit 
Gabriel Flores for the two point 
conversion, making the score 8-0.

Munoz, leading the defensive 
secondary, scored his second 
T.D. of the night by returning an 
interception 25 yards for the T.D. 
The PAT was successful and the 
Cubs led 15-0 at the half.

Second half scoring began in 
the third quarter when Lalo 
Rodriquez bulled over from the 
five yard line, but hooked his 
PAT to the left. Two more scores 
followed during the fourth 
quarter. The first, a two yard 
ramble by Roger Matrinez. The 
second, again Martinez as he 
motored 48 yards for the last T.D. 
of the game, making the score in 
favor of the Cubs 35-0.

“ Hopefully we will be able to 
play like we did against Big Lake 
all season,’’ said Payne.

Defensive standouts for the 
Cubs were Mark Fierro and Lalo 
Rodriquez each with seven 
tackles. Roger Martinez had 
eight and Andy Stokes had five.

George Ybarra was injured in 
Thursday’s game. At this time, 
there is no report of his condition 
and whether he will be out for a 
majority of the season.

By T. C. Tucker

After Big Lake scored with 
thirty-two seconds left in the first 
half, the future looked grim for 
the Ozona J.V. last Thursday. 
The first half had been a hard 
fought draw, with Big Lake 
scoring twice late in the second 
quarter. But Ozona took the ball 
and moved it ninety yards behind 
the outstanding passing and 
running of quarterback Darrell 
Vargas. He hit Sub Fierro on a 29 
yard pass to score with no time 
left on the clock.

However, Ozona could not turn 
any of their second half pos­
sessions into scoring drives. They 
were plagued with costly mis­

takes and received the worst end 
of the deal in the 28-7 loss to Big 
Lake.

Ozona moved the ball well 
offensively. They had 88 yards 
passing, with Vargas completing 
fifty percent of his passes. Sub 
Fierro rushed for 69 yards that 
helped Ozona to 260 yards total 
offense.

Ozona commited mistakes at 
crucial times in the ballgame, 
which the Owls took advantage of 
to score their 28 points.

Defensive leaders were Danny 
Sanchez and Jeff Sanchez with 
eight tackles each, followed by 
Brett Hood with six, and Ben Rios 
with five.
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4-H course teaches safety

A camel can go without water for 
almost a week, and without food 
for much longer.

The hunting season offers 
youth who have participated in 
the 4-H Shooting Sports program 
an opportunity to practice their 
skills, says Billy Reagor, county 
agent with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, Texas A&M 
University System.

With thousands of people 
enjoying hunting with friends and 
relatives, young, safe hunters can 
take the lead in avoiding acci­
dents, he says.

Reagor reminds hunters that 
most accidents occur in and 
around private homes and ve­
hicles. He urges youth and adults 
to review the following 10 com­
mandments of gun safety and 
apply them at all times in all 
locations.

—Treat every gun with the 
respect due a loaded gun.

-Watch that muzzle! Carry 
your gun safely. Keep the safety 
on until ready to shoot.

-Unload guns when not in 
use, take down or have actions 
open. Guns should be carried in 
cases to shooting area.

-Be sure the barrel is clear of 
obstructions and that you have

only the proper-sized ammunition 
for the gun you carry.

-Be sure of the target before 
you pull the trigger. Know 
identifying features of the game 
you hunt.

-Never point a gun at anything 
you do not want to shoot. Avoid 
all horseplay
-Never climb a tree or fence or

jump a ditch with a loaded gun. 
Never pull a gun toward you by 
the mnz/le.

-Never shoot a bullet at a flat, 
hard surface or water. At targei 
practice, be sure your backstop is 
adequate.

-Store guns and ammunition 
separately, beyond reach of 
children.

The Texas 4-H Shooting Sports 
program is conducted through 
the county Extension office with 
the help of volunteer leaders. If 
you would like to participate, 
contact the county Extension 
office for more information.

Hays to be 
relief doctor

Dr. Allen Hays of Odessa will 
be treating patients here for the 
next two weeks in the absence of 
Dr. Carlilse and Dr. Owensby.

Hays will be working out of the 
Emergency Room at Crockett 
County Memorial. Anyone who is 
not an emergency patient can be 
treated there as an out patient, 
and emergency room fees will not 
be charged in those cases.
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Barnhart Ewii Stop
BARNHART, TEXASHIGHWAY 67

Coke Classic(Hot) $PVepack
Winners of prizes at Saturday’s Grand Opening 
were :

Eddie Albin of San Angelo - 
Ronda Graves of Barnhart 
Neal Garcia of San Angelo- Hot-air popcorn popper

Clock radio 
5” Portable T.V.

store hours: Mon. - Thurs.
Sun. 1-6 p.m.

6-9 p.m. Fri.-Sat. 6-10 p.m.

SPECIAL
Consumer Steel Radial Tires

195/75R14 $33.50

205/75R14

205/75R15

215/75R15

225/75R15

235/75R15

36.50

36.50

38.50 

40.00

43.50

Check our 
prices on 

Michelin Tires

HOMECOMING MUMS
iiarge F oo tball M um, fully dressed $10.00 
Large F oo tball M um , plain, bow only $7^  

’  ̂ C hild’s M um $ 7*

ip ther sp ir it  item s $5 ’̂̂* and up

Free 50% Replacem ent 
W orkm anship & M a te ria l W arran ty

Price does not include mounting and balancing

Wool Growers Central Storage Co.
607 Ave H Ozona, Texas 392-3731
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24% FU LL  
LE A D  CRYSTAL

THIS WEEK’S 
FEATURE ITEM

W IN E
GLASS ^ le ? ^

With Each t5 .0 0  Purchase 
Regular Retail f  3 99

M atching Acccsaorics Also Available.
Sec Store Dispby For Complete Details.

CAMPBELL'S

TOMATO

$
lOH oz.

CANS

Chuck Roast Fresh 73% Lean

Ground Beef

LB.99C

I Heavy Grain Fed Beef naM casHH

I 7-Bone Chuck Roast $1”
Heavy Grain Fed Beef LB.

", 7-Bone Chuck SteakxB.SP’
I Heavy Grain Fed Beef
I Arm Roast
I Heavy Grain Fed Beef to

Swiss Steak

Heavy Grain Fed Beef

Beef Short Rihs l b . 99*
Fresh Express Large Deluxe

NABISCO PREMIUM SALTINE

CRACKERS
Z I ^ T V  SPECIAl

Combination or Pepperoni
Pizza 2/$4” t

_Louis Rich Fully Cooked
Breast of Turkey Portions-Oven 
Ready-Smoked or Bar-B-Que n 
1 to 2 lb portions lb. $ 3 ^

TV SPECIAL

ALL GRINDS

FOLGER'S

COOL DAIRY BUYS

ALWAYS FRESH

SOLID OLEO
1 LB. 
PKGS.

FLEISCHAAANN'S QUARTERED

MARGARINE
JALAPENO OR PLAIN KRAFT

CHEEZ-WHIZ
PILLSBURY BTRMILK/SWTMIIK

BISCUITS

1 LB. 
PKG.

16 OZ. 
JAR

7Vt OZ. 
CANS

EAST TEXAS GOLDEN YELLOW

YAMS

LARGE GREEN PERSIAN

LIMES
VINE RIPENED

CANTALOUPE
RED ROME EXTRA FANCY

APPLES
CRISP GOLDEN

CARROTS
SWEET

YELLOW ONIONS

LB.

LB.

LB.

1 LB. 
PKG.

LB.

GREEN GAINT CREAM ST/WH. KERNEL

GOLDEN CORN

9 9 *
GREEN GIANT

SWEET PEAS
2  'i& 9 9 *

GREEN GIANT BLUE LAKE REG. CUT/

GREEN BEANS”*
GREEN GIANT GOLDEN WH. KERNEL M

NIBLETScorn a
GREEN GIANT SLICED OR WHOLE

MUSHROOMS
QUICK COOKING RICE

MINUTE RICE

16 OZ. 
I CANS

12 OZ. 
CANS

4.5 OZ. 
CAN

28 OZ. 
BOX

IMFFIIIATED 
FOODS INC. „  . Come Home for Good!

STORE
COUPONS

NO
DOUBLE VALUE

on Double Coupon D ay

2 lb. Velveeta

40% OFF
STORE COUPON

O’ Instant Nestea

50% OFF
STORE COUPON

Bounty Towels

25% OFF
STORE COUPON

KRAFT
Catalina Dressing

20 oz.^onus Pk.

20%  o f f
STORE COUPON

100 ct. Lipton Tea 
Bags

40% OFF
STORE COUPON

Gal. O orox Bleach

30%OFF
STORE COUPON

22 OZ.-32 OZ.-48 oz, 
Palmolive Liquid

30% OFF
STORE COUPON

175 ct.
Kleenex Tissue
40%OFF

I STORE COUPON

Products of 
Coca Cola

20 % OFF
ISTORE COUPON

WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS 
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUAHTITIES

Gandy’s Í/2 Gal.
Ice Qeam or Sherhert

60% OFF
iSTORE COUPON

T-Bone Steak

50% off
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Staying busy is way o f life By Cynthia Harrell Hodges Alpha Alpha Mu meeting 4-H meeting
Working six days a week, 

walking one mile a day and riding 
three to four miles a day on her 
exercise bicycle are the keys to 
the fountain of youth for Vera 
Baker, local beautician and owner 
of her own business for 51 years.

“ I’ll never retire unless I get 
sick. I enjoy my wo^k and the 
people,” says Miss Vera. “ If I 
didn’t work I would be in a 
rocker. No one visits anymore. 
When you quit, you just give 
up,” she said during a recent 
interview.

Miss Vera attended Sellers 
Beauty School in Fort Worth. “ I 
had to drop out after three 
months, because my mother was 
ill,” she said. While her young 
daughter, Jean, stayed with her 
parents, she returned and com­
pleted the last three months of 
the six month program. “ I was a 
member of the last class that did 
not have to take a state board 
examination in Austin.”

Not having to take a written 
test was a lucky break for Miss 
Vera who just did not like tests or 
books. Miss Vera moved to Ozona 
when she was 12 years old with 
her father, Frank Taylor. Taylor 
had ranched on the Beaver Lake 
Ranch near Juno for many years. 
“ Papa helped me go to school, as 
my mother died before I finish­
ed.”

When she returned from 
beauty school. Miss Vera went to 
work for Pat Brown in 1934. 
When I first started working for 
her, shampoos and sets cost 
$1.75. I worked for Pat for four 
years, and then she sold her 
business. The lady who bought 
the shop had her own operators. 
She told me to find another job. 
By that time, I knew I could make 
it on my own.”

Three or four close friends 
called and offered to help Miss 
Vera go into business for herself. 
She decided against using theirf 
financial aid and opted instead to 
call the supply houses and see if 
they would extend credit. “The 
beauty supply places let me have 
credit.”

The equipment has really 
changed over the years. “ We 
started with the old type spiral 
wrap machine. Curlers were 
attached to the machine and were 
over head.’’ The next innovation 
in the business was the crocono 
(waves were heated with things 
on a machine - they were clamped 
on with a pad, and the curlers 
would spew a chemical which 
would curl the hair.)

The cold waves now in use are 
much easier to use, she com­
mented.

“ I think when I started, there 
was a better chance of doing 
good. People were then anxious 
to look their best, and mothers 
often brought their children to 
the beauty shop for a shampoo 
and set. Now mothers do their 
children’s hair at home,” Miss 
Vera said.

The husband of one of her late 
customers, the late N. W. 
Graham, once told Miss Vera that 
he thought beauty shops had 
done more for American women

OPEN IN OZONA
For a Limited Time

THE OL’ COBBLER 
Complete

Boot & Shoe Repairing
Next door to the Border Patrol office 
_____  on 11th street

Brown Furniture Company
Open Monday through Friday 

Closed on Saturday

profession to first work for 
someone else for two or three 
years and let them teach you 
about the business. “ Being an 
operator and being in business 
for yourself are two different 
things. I watched Pat when I 
didn’t have customers to learn 
how to do things and how to 
relate to customers.”

Being a shop owner is a 
difficult thing. “There is the 
mental strain of owning a busi­
ness and learning how to keep 
customers. You need to first learn 
how to work, and then open a 
shop.

“You’re never smarter than 
when you first get out of school. 
Going to school merely gives a 
person a license to operate. You 
need hands on experience. You 
need to let someone train you.”

Miss Vera is an avid Cowboys 
fan. “ I enjoy watching any sports 
on television.” Being in business 
has restricted her community 
activity. “ I am always busy 
getting someone else ready for an 
event. I really don’t enjoy clubs 
and just don’t have time for 
them.”

Miss Vera enjoys fishing in her

The Alpha Alpha Mu chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi met Monday 
evening in the home of Karen and 
Vince Huffman. Hostesses were 
Tina Bean, Becky Dillard and 
Karen Huffman.

Tina Bean began the program 
by leading the ladies in a series of 
stress-relieving exercises. These 
were followed by a presentation 
of how stress can tamper with our 
daily activities. Refreshments 
were served following the pro­
gram.

Leslie Wilson presided over the 
business meeting. Discussion in­
cluded individual responsibilities 
for an upcoming service project. 
Secret Sister gifts were later 
exchanged.

The members present were 
Tina Bean, Tammy Bunger, 
Becky Dillard, Debbie Glasscock, 
Laurie Hale, Jeannine Hender­
son, Karen Huffman, Connie 
Jennings, Ellen Lipsey, Susan 
McMullan, Barbie Myers, Renee 
Pearl, Dena Porter, Leslie 
Reeves, Billie Renfro, Rhonda 
Shaw, Rita Sigwing, Roylan Sulli-

van, Marcy Williams and Leslie 
Wilson.

Connie Jennings reporting

Mrs. McCartney 
attends classes

Mrs. Ann McCartney, ac­
tivities director at the Crockett 
County Care Center, was in 
Midland September 17 and 18 to 
attend two classes for pro­
fessionals in human services.

She earned hours of credit 
toward certification of Social 
Worker, Assoc, through her 
participation in the classes Re­
sponding to Anger and Hostility: 
Effective Intervention Skills and 
Safety Issues, and Coping Under 
Pressure: Stress Management 
Strategies for Professionals in 
Human Services.

On Monday, September 16, 56 
parents and 4-H’ers met at the 
Intermediate School cafeteria.

Officers for the 1985-86 year 
were elected. They are: Whitney 
Vannoy, president; Julie Child­
ress, vice-president; Crista 
Chalmers, secretary; JoLynn 
Vannoy and Gabriel Vasquez, 
third grade delegates; Gary 
Thompson and Mindy Coates, 
fourth grade delegates; Jennifer 
Davidson and Chad Upham, fifth 
grade delegates.

All members worked on ban­
ners for the 4-H County Awards 
Program to be held October 7, 
1985.

Refreshments were served by 
parents.

Crista Chalmers, reporter

In some parts of the Sahara Desert 
there are underground streams. 
People digging for water can some­
times catch fish.

Programs develop family strength
than almost anything. The late 
Mr. Graham felt that beauty 
shops had helped women have a 
better self image and be more 
self confident.

“ Most of my clientele is older 
now. Many come to the beauty 
shop because it is hard physically 
for them to wash their hair. I have 
served up to five generations of 
the same family.”

The business woman and 
friend to her many patrons went 
into this profession because she 
had a young high school daugh­
ter, Jean, and she wanted to 
provide a comfortable life for 
both Jean and herself following 
the breakup of her marriage.

“ It has paid off. I’ve worked 
long hours. I’ve never com­
plained because of the hours. If 
someone needs something done. 
I’ll find a place for them,” Miss 
Vera said.

“ I owe all my success to my 
patrons. We have shared all our 
joys and sorrows together. I feel 
like I am a member of their 
family. When they go op a trip, 
and come back and tell me about 
it, I feel as if I have been on 
vacation with them. They are my 
dearest friends. They would help 
me if I really needed anything.

“ We are like one big family. I 
miss them if they don’t come. 
You learn who is your friend, and 
who isn’t. I’ve loved all my 
customers,” said the over 80 
years young operator.

She advises those entering the

limited spare time. She manages 
to close her business for two 
weeks each year. “ I am closed 
for one week at Christmas time 
and one week in the summer. 
Then I will visit my family and 
rest,” she says with a twinkle in 
her eyes.

“ I willingly tie myself down to 
this business. The biggest com­
pliment I can receive is to have 
someone come in and thank me 
for doing such a good job.”

The lifelong member of First 
Baptist Church believes that 
senior citizens must help them­
selves by staying involved and 
active. 1 have had wonderful 
health. I never go to a doctor and 
never complain to my customers.

Miss Vera is extremely proud 
of her family. Her daughter Jean 
has been married for many years 
to Eddie Bower. Bower is retired

Most children over the age of 
eight are occasionally left at 
home without adult supervision. 
In fact, due to the large pro­
portion of households with all 
adults employed, coupled with 
the difficulty of finding after 
school care, many school-age 
children regularly spend time 
alone at home.

Most parents are concerned 
that this time be spent safely, 
confidently, and constructively. 
Many children fix their own 
snacks, answer the telephone, do 
homework, chores, and entertain 
themselves until their parents 
arrive from work.

For this reason, the Extension 
Home Economics Committee of 
the Crockett County Program 
Building Committee has co­

ordinated a series addressing the 
responsible after-school-self-care 
for children. Parents and children 
are encouraged to participate.

The series will be held Sep­
tember 23 and 30, 7:00 - 9:00 
p.m. at the Civic Center.

On September 23, Joy Isier, 
Texas Department of Human 
Services representative from San 
Angelo, concentrated on per­
sonal crime prevention, door and 
telephone safety techniques. Dee 
Keilers and Dorris Haire, 
Crockett County firemen, dis­
cussed first aid and fire preven­
tion for families. EMT Doug 
Meador spoke on preventative 
first aid measures for the family.

On September 30, Kathryn 
Russell, Ozona Primary School 
teacher, will address loneliness,

boredom and leisure time. Jan 
North, Ozona High School Home 
Economics teacher, will demon­
strate nutritious snacks and 
meals for children. Ken Harrison, 
Methodist pastor, will concude 
the series with a session handling 
household  re sp o n s ib ilitie s  
(chores).

Primary goals of the “ Fami­
lies Working Together” series 
are to develop a sense of security, 
independence and accomplish­
ment in children, to develop in 
children skills necessary for 
responsible self-care routine as 
well as emergencies, and to help 
parents and children develop 
common sense guidelines for 
responsible self-care.

from LTV, and they live in 
Dallas. Her granddaughter, 
Joan, is married to Charles 
Martin, an executive with Haggar 
Slacks Co. The Martins have four 
children. The oldest, Charlie, is a

Yarborough has enthusiasm for basketball
By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

“ I really wasn’t interested in

There is real good team leader­
ship,” says Miss Yarborough. 
“ They have shown a willingness

first vear law student at Texas making a change,” Rhonda Yar- to change, both the way they do first, year law StUflent at thinos rm tbP mnrt «nrl tbpir
Tech University. Charlie^ 
graduated from Washington Ind 
Lee University in Lexington, VA 
last year. A daughter, Kim, is a 
sophomore at the University of 
Texas. The second daughter 
attends Highland Park High 
School, and Kevin, the youngest, 
attends the Episcopal School for 
Boys in Lynchburg, VA.

That her customers think 
highly of Miss Vera is evident by 
the gold beaded necklace which 
she wears constantly around her 
neck. Each bead was given to her 
by one of her customers on either 
her birthday or for Christmas.

' boroughgirjs’ head bai^ketball 
afid track’ cdach '̂” said Recently. 
“ Coach Rip Sewell asked me for 
one minute of my time. During 
that time,he talked about how 
nice the people were in Ozona, 
about the wonderful teens, and at 
the end of the one minute talk, I 
was interested in the job.”

Miss Yarborough had coached 
for 10 years in Goldthwaite, 
leading the varisty to a 276-49 
winning record. The junior var­
sity under her direction had a 
122-38 record, and her junior 
high teams had a 288-37 record.

“ The girls work hard here.

' B a g g e t t .  
A g ö j n '

P O DRAWER .T 
OZONA, TEXAS 76943

PHONE 915/392-2606

E stab lished  in 1927

things on the court and their 
overall attitude.”

“ I have not been disappointed 
since I moved here. My sister and 
brother-in-law teach in Andrews 
and kept telling me how wonder­
ful the people of West Texas 
were.”

Miss Yarborough graduated 
valedictorian of her 1973 Lometa 
High School class. The 1975 
summa cum laude graduate of 
Howard Payne University was 
named the Outstanding Female 
Physical Education Major of 
1975. Her teams in Goldthwaite 
were winners of eight district 
basketball championships, four 
bi-district championships and two 
area basketball championships.

Miss Yarborough also teaches 
health and coordinates all girls’ 
athletic programs in grades 7-12. 
The health course includes more 
than nutrition. It covers child 
abuse, drug and alcohol abuse

and teen suicide. The goals of the 
course are to “ improve the 
students’ self-image and help 
them through all phases of their 
development.”

House Bill 72 has really hurt 
the athletic programs. The or­
ganizer of the Goldthwaite Na­
tional Honor Society feels it is 
“ unfair to hold a person out for 
a six-week period. This can wipe 
out an entire season.” Grades 
must be kept up, “but the 
probation period should be 
evaluated on a weekly basis.”

The Junior Class sponsor was 
named Central Texas Girls’ 
Coach of the Year in 1977, 1979, 
1980 and 1982. She also taught 
English and speech of 10 years at 
Goldthwaite.

“ This is a very competitive 
district which includes Crane', 
Coahoma, Sonora, Colorado City 
and Ballinger. Rene Shultz and 
Martha Sims, who coach at the 
elementary and junior high 
levels, give the younger girls 
excellent training,” says Miss 
Yarborough.

Charlie’s Place

Saturday Special
M rloin S teak

Baked P otato  or French F ries  
Salad Bar C offee or Iced Tea

s7 j COSIUMES

'1 S n w i 9fo2liioiis

Sizes extra small to adult 
Place your order now!

Last date to order is Oct. 1st
Choose between:

^  Pumpkin Bunny 
★  Bee ★  Ladybug 

★  Sheep

★  Bat 
★  Butterfly

Phone:392-3226  '  1004 Ave. E.

Come in and see!
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Bless the Lord, oh my Soul
THE CROCKETT COUNTY NEWS PAGE 5

By Connie Marroquin 
Church o f God of Prophecy

Psalms 103:1

inYou know, we are living 
times that we are so busy doing 
so much. We are working so 
hard; we are coming and going, 
doing this and doing that, and 
before we know it, the day is 
over. But in our busy day we 
didn’t take time to praise the One 
that has given us life. We forget 
that without God we are nothing. 
We forget that it’s the Lord that* 
has given us all that we have.

So, don’t you think we should 
take a break each day to thank 
Him and to praise and bless Him 
with all our souls; thank Him for 
loving us so much that He gave

His Son to die on the cross for us; 
for the priviledge of knowing that 
in Him we have everlasting life; 
for healing our bodies; for our 
families and loved ones, our 
friends, our churches. Oh, there 
are so many more wonderful 
blessings that He has given us.

Don’t you think that our God is 
worthy of our praises? Yes, He is 
indeed!

Take a few minutes before you 
start your day and just bless Him 
and praise His sweet, holy name. 
Tell Him how much you love Him 
and appreciate Him.

Enter into His gates with 
thanksgiving, and into His courts 
with praise. Be thankful unto 
Him and bless His name. Psalms 
100:4.

May the Lord richly bless you 
is my prayer.

Center provides quality 
care for children

SING-A-LONG AT  
CALVARY BAPTIST

The public is invited to come 
and take part in a sing-a-long at 
Calvary Baptist Church Sunday 
night, September 29, at 7:00 p.m.

MEXICAN SUPPER FRIDAY

A take out Mexican supper will 
be available Friday, September 
27, from 5 until 7:30 p.m. at the 
Methodist Fellowship Hall. Or­
ders should be placed by calling 
392-2738 by the deadline of 
Thursday, September 26.

Plates are $3.50 for adults and 
$2.50 for children.

Plates will be delivered to 
senior citizens upon request.

All proceeds are to benefit the 
Senior Methodist Youth.

Ladies Golf Day
Ladies Golf Association weekly 

winners at the Country Club last 
week were: low gross with a 93, 
Marie White; low net and low 
putts was Mary Webster.

Blind Bogey winners were 
Dorothy Montgomery, Donna 
Sanders, Ella Clegg and Mary 
Webster.

Other golfers were Jimmie 
Jacoby, Jonesy Williams, Bobbie 
Fatout, Katy Jones, Sherry Holt 
and Jeanie Wellman.

METHODIST RALLY 
IN MERTZON

Ozona citizens are invited to 
attend a fall rally sponsored by 
the San Angelo district of the 
United Methodist Church at 5 
p.m. Sunday, September 29, in 
the Mertzon Community Center.

The Rev. DeForrest Wiksten, 
pastor of First United Methodist 
Church in Wichita Falls, will talk 
about family life.

A supper will start at 5 p.m., 
followed by Rev. Wiksten’s talk 
at 6 p.m. The rally will continue 
with small group discussions at 7 
p.m. and will conclude about 8 
p.m.

BIBLE STUDY AT  
CHURCH

CATHOLIC

“ I’ve learned a lot of patience 
and to really jinderstand the 
needs of children,’’ Patti Coates, 
director of the Ozona Day Care 
Center, said recently.

The Day Care Center has three 
major fund raising events each 
year to supplement its operating 
budget. This past Friday, a 
spaghetti supper which served 
215 persons was held prior to the 
Big Lake - Ozona football game at 
the Civic Center. Other fund 
raisers this year included a 
Mother’s Day dinner in May and 
an ice cream booth at the Blue 
Grass Festival in July. “ We 
average approximately $300 per 
event,’’ Lou Haire said. “ We 
were very pleased with the turn­
out for the spahgetti supper. A 
big thank you to all who helped,” 
Ms. Haire said.

The purpose of the Day Care 
Center is to provide quality care 
for young children. It is open 
from 7:45 a.m. to 6 p.m. Monday 
through Friday. The fee is $48 
per week for the first child and 
$34 for the second child in a 
family. There is a $5 registration 
fee to help defray the cost of 
supplies.

“ It is a challenge to make sure 
that everything runs smoothly,” 
said Mrs. Coates. She has been 
with the center since it first 
opened in 1981. She assumed her 
present position when Barbara 
Rice moved to Alaska.

“ There is a big demand for the 
center. If we did not have the

North and Gary Vanoy. Each 
board member serves for a two 
year term. Four rotate off the 
board each year. Patti Coates and 
Rev. and Mrs. Ken Harrison 
attend the board meetings, but 
are not official members of the 
board. This board oversees the 
policies of the center.

The center is licensed by the 
Texas Department of Human 
Resources. Donna Baker is the 
licensing agent for the Day Care 
Center.

The center will accept do­
nations of books, toys, games, 
puzzles, records and “ dress up” 
clothes, Mrs. Coates said. The 
Ozona Woman’s League has 
recently donated a merry-go- 
round, and “we hope to get a 
slide in the near future.”

The center will soon have a 
safety program, teaching the 
young children to “ never talk to 
strangers” .

Mrs. Coates is married to Fleet 
Coates and is the mother of 
nine-year-old fourth grader 
Mindy and six-year-old kinder­
gartener Andy.

Snips, quips 
&

lifts
Most of us can have a grand 

time thinking of what a grand 
time we’d be having if we were 
only having it.

Husbands may not be the best 
informed people, but they are the 
most.

The easiest way to live within 
your income is now and then.

We live in the present; we 
dream of the future, and we learn 
eternal truth , from the past.

«4c9|n|t
After putting two and two 

together, we sometimes wish we 
had kept them apart.

DOES THIS SOUND FAMILIAR?

By Lottie Lee Baker

A LIFT FOR THE WEEK

Make a success of today, and 
you need not worry about to­
morrow.

‘The dress
women

like
love

IPs a boy
Lucille and Joel Huff are the 

parents of a son, Philip Joel, born 
September 11, 1985, in Lederach, 
PA. The baby was 21 inchers long 
and weighed in at seven pounds, 
13 ounces.

Joining his parents in making 
him welcome are sisters Melissa,

Bible classes began Thursday, 
September 19, at Our Lady of 
Perpetual Help Church. Classes 
are being held at 10:00 a.m. to 
11:00 a.m. and 8:00 p.m. to 9:00 
p.m. in the Parish Hall. Topics to 
be discussed during the studies 
are basic facts about the Bible: 
Revelation, Covenant, Law, Sin, 
Redemption, Messiah and Love 
in both the Old and New Testa­
ments.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Hyde last weekend were Mike, 
Mary Jo and Reagan Jernigan of 
Iraan, Florence and Jack Hinton 
of Eldorado.

center, who would watch the o _j au- i r. j
children? The children easilv Abigail, age 6. Proudchildren. The children easily grandparents are Mr. and Mrs.

Pies Chlidress Jr. and Mr. and 
Mrs. R. V. Huff.

adapt to the routine here,” Mrs. 
Coates said.

Belinda Wilkins is in charge of 
the three and four year olds; 
Wendy Tambunga has the tod­
dlers’ class; Martha Montgomery 
has the after school group; and 
Susie Harrison cooks.

The Ozona Day Care Center is 
a non-profit organization, related 
to the Ozona United Methodist 
Church. It is governed by a board 
of directors. Serving on the board 
are: Lou Haire, chairman; Lupe 
Sanchez, Beth Boyd, Elizabeth 
Upham, Becky Childress, Jean- 
ett^p  ̂Robinson, vice-chairman;'
Vij;j^e Stokes,f Helen Beapv Jan

young men 
"  children now 

luxury, have bad manners, con­
tempt for authority, show dis­
respect for their elders, and love 
chatter in place of exercise. 
Children are not tyrants, not 
servants of their households. 
They no longer rise when elders 
enter the room. They contradict 
their parents, chatter before 
company, gobble up their dain­
ties at the table, cross their legs, 
and tyrannize over their 
teachers.”

This was written by Socrates, 
who lived 467-400 B.C.

EARN
10%

4 YEARS

9.5%
2V2 YEARS

9375%

i
■'»O.

m
*ffr
Sr-i»

S fe p  On Hr
HURRY over to

Buttery
Motor Company
Time is running out on

7.7% Financing
Now available again on most all 

of GM models - 
plus pickups

Vz tons, y4 tons and 1 tons.
Don't put off any longer the car 
or pickup you’ve been wanting.

o r a f e s i
Sept.

Join the Excitement
Celebrate High Attendance Day

in Sunday School at First Baptist Church 
Sunday at 9:45

Classes for all ages which include 
two couples classes and a singles class 

(Single, divorced, widowed)

Call 392-5830 for hus pickup
special activities on bus this Sunday.

1 YEAR

9.25%
6 MONTHS

9.00%
90 DAY

8.75%
30 DAYS

FSLIC insured to $100,000 for 
each account. Rates subject 
to change without notice and 
substantial interest penalties 
required for early with­
drawal.

STOCKTON 
SAVINGS 

ASSOCIATION 
“Since 1957” 
Ozona, Texas 

CALL COLLECT 
392-3776

Specials
Monday $3* 
Mexican Plate

with tea and coffee

Thursday $3^
Mini Pizza

(One Topping)
Salad Bar Tea

Saturday $4^ 
M ed. Pizza

(One Topping)

EVERY Sunday $4

$3 95

or
Wednesday 
Chicken Fry
Hamburger Steak

Fries and Salad Bar 
Coffee or Tea

Friday $4’®
Steak and Fries
Salad Bar Coffee or Tea

95

& Trimmmgs
Salad Bar Dessert Coffe or Tea

392-2906
HV^Y 290 O Z O N A  TX

Also serving daOy lunches OPEN 7:30 - 10d)0 Closed Tuesdays
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Lion Fever...
CATCH IT!

Ozona Lions vs Staton Buffaloes
This Friday, In Lions Stadlmn

Introducing The Ozona Lions

ri^
A

m
JAMES SANCHEZ

James Sanchez, a five year veteran of the 
football program, would like to be an all 
state fullback his senior year. For his junior 
year, he wants to be on the all district team.

The son of Tony and Lupe Sanchez plays 
football because of the “ good coaches and 
“ good coaches and good conditioning. I love 
to hit!”

The junior is active in FFA and VICA 
programs at school. He plans to “ pass all 
my subjects with a good average.

Sanchez enjoys girls, working, friends, 
hunting, fishing and wrestling with his 
brothers. Becoming a mechanic or welder 
are his long term career goals.

DEAN TAMBUNGA
Becoming an auto mechanic or welder are 

the long term goals of Dean Tambunga, a 
three year veteran of the football program.

Tambunga is striving for a place on the 1st 
string varsity team and wants to “ do all I 
can for my team--to help them ̂ have a 
successful year.

The son of Mrs. Elena Tambunga enjoys 
playing drums and listening to music. He is 
a member of a band.

STEVE SANCHEZ
Steve Sanchez, son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Ventura Sanchez, says sports provide 
enjoyment and pride. “ You learn about life 
and how to be a winner.”

The five year football veteran wants to 
“ be a success in whatever occupation I 
choose.” He wants to make the all district 
team in football and the all region team in 
basketball.

Classes, teachers, athletics and graduat­
ing with honors are his long term goals. 
Sanchez enjoys listening to music and 
playing sports in his spare time.

The following businesses and Individuals are

(  J. B. MiUer and Co. Ozona National Bank The Aycock Family
^  B & C Automotive Circle Bar Truck Corral The Red Apple
i  Qayton’s Village Drug El Chato’s Seven-U Ranch Company
J  Happy Hollow Leo Cervantez Exxon Wagoner-Perry Motors, Inc.
j  Pepe’s Chem-Solv Corporation Wool Growers
F Westerman Drug Baggett Insurance i^ency Upham insurance Agency
w Watson’s Ozona Butane Kyle Kleaners
$  SmaU Fashions Sizemore Funeral Home J. W. Motor Co.
5  Buttery Motors Maness Texaco Dairy King
^ White’s Auto South Permian, Inc. Crockett County Water Dept.
J  Mayfield Construction Tite Bishop Welding Service Stockton Savings
i  House of Flowers Monica’s Hair and NaUs KWIK-Marc
J  Donuts Etc. Double C. Enterprises Crockett County National Bank
¥  Brock and Camille Jones ■k Gary Vannoy Dina’s Poco Taco
^  Moore Ofi Company Sonny’s Drive In Thornton’s Supermarket
¥  The Teacher Store Perry’s Western Auto
$  De La Rosa Plumbing Jessie’s Tire Shop La Cocina
k  The Footnote Crockett County News Danny’s Texaco
^  South Texas Lumber Co. 
¥

Qiarlie’s Place

M
¥

M
M

■■■¥.MM

¥¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
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Medical fund established for Allen Officers have busy week

Funds to help with medical 
fees for Tommy Joe Allen have 
been established at Crockett 
County National Bank and Ozona 
National Bank by friends of the 
injured man. Allen received 
massive injuries in an accident 
September 10 in Fresno, Cali­
fornia.

Allen has undergone surgery 
for broken jaws, crushed legs and

damage to his left cheek says his 
father, - Tom Allen, - who- has 
returned from California .where 
he was able to be with his son.

Tommy Joe has developed 
pneumonia this week and faces 
two months in the hospital says 
his father. It will be'six months 
before Tommy Joe can possibly 
be able to return to his job with 
the IRS in Fresno.

Library Memorials
Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Williamson 

in memory of Katrina H. Pullen 
The Marshall Montgomerys in 

memory of John W. Henderson 
III, Jeanette G. Bailey, Mary 
Bohannon and Hal Easley

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bean in 
memory of Mrs. Clara Pope 
Willoughby, Carra Mae Barber, 
Mary Gladine Teele and Mary 
Elizabeth Simpson.

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Ledoux in 
memory of Charles Ray Hardin 

Mr. and Mrs. Perry Hubbard 
in memory of Jeanette G. Bailey, 
Mary Gladine Teele, Shannon 
Southern and Katrina H. Pullen 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Arledge in 
memory of Shannon Southern 

Mr. and Mrs. B. W. Stuart in 
memory of John W. Henderson 
III, Jeanette G. Bailey, Arthur B. 
Phillips, J. B. Green, Katrina H. 
Pullen and Cotton Goodman 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Vandiver in 
memory of Shannon Southern 

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Harrison in 
memory of Jeanette G. Bailey 
and Guida B. Chilton

If you save as much 
in the next five years as the 

last five, will you be satisfied?

Chances are you won’t. Saving isn’t easy, and 
increasing your savings is even more difficult. 
But with Farmers Interest Sensitive Whole Life>̂  it’s 
attainable.

You get a built-in cash value savings ..feature 
that pays current, com petitive interest. Right 
now it’s 12% (4V2% of which is guaranteed). The 
guarantee remains constant. The high interest 
rate fluctuates with the money market.

This new Farmers Interest Sensitive Whole Life has 
a very competitive premium. Also, it provides 
guaranteed life insurance, and cash values which 
compound annually.

There are other advantages, which I, your fast, 
fair, and friendly Farmers Agent, can tell you.

ELIZABETH UPHAM 
A gent

Farmers New  World Life Insurance Co 
Mercer Island, W A

1012 Avenue E Post Office Drawer U 
BUS.-392-2883 R es.-392-2334

Officers of the Crockett County 
Sheriff’s Department inves­
tigated an oil field theft Sep­
tember 20 at a rig on Howard 
Draw road. 250 barrels of DRS 
Pack were reported stolen from 
the location.

The alarm at South Texas 
Lumber Company sounded at 
5:20 a.m. September 19. Investi­
gating officers foiind it to be a 
false alarm.

A subject 'was arrested Sep­
tember 21 on charges of public 
intoxication and criminal mischief

in connection with the breaking of 
a window at The Red Apple.

Under investigation is the 
break-in of a vending machine at 
I-IO Exxon on Sept. 21.

Assists were given with three 
ambulance calls, one in connec­
tion with a wreck IV2 miles east 
of Ozona on Hwy. 290.

Four disturbance calls were 
answereid, and one stolen vehicle 
report was received.

Crockett County Jail housed 27 
illegal aliens during the week.

Care Center 
News

By Ann McCartney 
Director of Activities 

and Social Care

Wreck hospitalizes four
A wreck 1V2 miles east of 

Ozona on Highway 290 sent four 
people to the hospital Friday 
morning. The accident occured at 
6:30 a.m. according to investi­
gating officers.

Peter Hunt, Diana Lozano and 
Paula Gillit of Ozona and Richard 
Avila of Rocksprings were taken 
to, Crockett County Memorial,

two by EMS ambulance and two 
by private vehicle. Avila was kept 
here overnight and released. The 
other three were transferred to 
Community Hospital in San An­
gelo with head injuries. The 
women were reported to be in 
serious condition, and Hunt also 
remained hospitalized at 
mid-week.

Aliens apprehended
The Billy Reagor Family in 

memory of Alma Kay Ramos and 
Katrina H. Pullen 

Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Cox III in 
memory of Jeanette G. Bailey 

The Pon Seaborn Family in 
memory of Doris Moore 

The Charles Womack Family in 
memory of Katrina H. Pullen, 
Jeanette G. Bailey and Shannon 
Southern

The Ladies Golf Association in 
memory of Jeanette G. Bailey 

The School Board of Trustees 
and the Administration Office 
Staff in memory of Katrina H. 
Pullen

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Baggett in 
memory of Mary Gladine Teele, 
Katrina H. Pullen, Shannon 
Southern and Wayne Wahl 

. Mrs. Vivian Thompson and 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Thompson 
in memory of Jeanette G. Bailey 
" Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Schroeder 
in memory of Katrina H. Pullen 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Fatout in 
memory of Jeanette G. Bailey 
and Katrina H. Pullen

, Border Patrol agents of Ozona 
apprehended a total of 42 de­
portable aliens for the week 
ending September 21.

Four smuggling cases were 
intercepted during the week with 
seven persons arrested trans­
porting a total of seven illegal 
aliens to various points in the 
United States ranging from 
Ozona to Dallas, and to Midland.

Seizure proceedings were 
initiated against three vehicles 
used in the transportation of the 
aliens.

Officers of the Crockett County 
Sheriff’s Department intercepted 
one smuggling case destined for 
Ozona and Dallas that was turned 
over to the Border Patrol.

DONUTS ETC.
392-5800

SPECIAL ORDERS
Open 
6 dayspies

dinner rolls 
cobblers  ̂a.ni. to 1 p.m.

cheesecakes
breads and hamburger buns 
hot sandwiches and foontidn drinks

This week has once again 
proven the value of volunteers. 
Without volunteers, some pro­
grams would not, in fact do not, 
happen.

On Tuesday and Wednesday of 
last week I was away at a training 
school. Volunteers kept bingo, 
ceramics and music going. 
Thanks, once again, to all of you.

Another volunteer we owe a 
big thank you to is Ralph 
Anderson. He came and gave us 
a slide presentation on his 
missionary travels to Asia.

The Bob Bell Band came on 
Tuesday night. Band members 
Bob Bell, George Hester, Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Racher, and Mr. 
and Mrs. John Babb gave their 
usual fine performance.

Wednesday, morning ceramic 
class was conducted by volun­
teers Alena Faye Hokit, Dorothy 
Doll, Mattie Cooper, Janet Wil­
son and Teresa Sanchez. Resi­
dents participating included Ola 
Mills, Hilda Dysart, Tomasa 
Ramoz, Moriama Perez, and 
Juana Hernandez.

Thanks go this week to Donuts, 
Etc. for bringing donuts, Anna 
Bell Patrick for donating pop 
corn, and Marilyn Bean for 
sharing the flower arrangements 
used at the worship services of 
the First Baptist Church.

Residents were pleased to have 
Ninfa Cervantez back to play the

piano on Wednesday afternoon.
Thursday morning’s beauty 

shop was manned by Alena Faye 
Hokit, Vivian Hughes and Clara 
Babb.

Thursday afternoon’s Bible 
study was led by Ted Turnley. 
Glenda Henderson played ‘the 
piano.

Spanish Hour of Praise had a 
special communion service led by 
Father Richard Altenbaugh and 
assisted by Maria Vitela, Paulita 
Leal, Carmen Vargas, Mariana 
Hernandez, Norma Flores, Vic­
toria DeLa Garza, Albina Tam- 
bunga, Isabel Molina and Porifia 
Borrego.

Tuesday and Friday bingo 
winners included: Ventura San­
chez, winner of the El Chato 
dinner for two certificate, Tomasa 
Ramoz, winner of the first place 
gift certificate from Watson’s 
Department Store, and Moriama 
Perez, second place winner. 
Volunteers included: Susie Leal, 
Maria Torres, Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Martinez, Mattie Cooper, Do­
rothy Doll, Elodia Zapata, Elvira 
Martinez, Alice Ross, Minnie 
Karr, Anna Bell Patrick and 
Gwen Nelson.

Friday afternoon we viewed a 
movie furnished through our 
public library system. It was a 
cute story about a dog with lots of 
pretty scenery.

This is the week to call if you
have a vacation trip to share!

Cancer Society Memorials
Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Green for 

Katrina Pullen, Jeanette Bailey, 
Shannon Southern

Mrs. Vera Baker for Mrs. 
Gladine Teele

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Carson for 
Jeanette Bailey, Katrina Pullen, 
Johnny Henderson, Winn Saun­
ders

Mr. and Mrs. James Dockery, 
Stacy and Shannon for Gladine 
Teele, Odessa Carmen, D. C. 
Ratliff

Dottie Mason for Gladine Teele 
Donna Beth Davidson for D. C. 

Ratliff

Jane M. Black, Memorials 
Chairman

CECIL WESTERMAN 
Would 
Like 
To Be

Women’s Aerobics Shoes
White Gold

Sixes 4 - 91/2 8 3 9 ® ®

Kaepa Tennis Shoes
Children’s

Sizes 10-6

8 2 9 ® ®

Ladies’
Sizes 5-8

8 4 7 ® ®

Men’s
Sizes 6 V2-II

8 4 7 ® ®

The Foot N ote
Ladies’ and Childrens’ shoes

Your
Pharmacist

392-2608

; LEO  
1 CERVANTEZ

901 5

whee 
1 ’ A fill! 

-jVith ti

^O JJ
Jheffield Rc 
3 9 2 ^ 2 .^1 balan 

service si
res and ball

»ad

cing
lationt
terieà

B a ck  to  sch oo l
Sunday
Chicken
sandwich

Daily Specials
Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday

$ 1
4 9

Burrito
with

French Fries 
or

Tator Tots

Chicken
strip

basket

$ 1 99

Corn dog 
with

French Fries 
or

Tator Tots

8 9

BBQ sandwich Hot Dog Ham and Checse|
with Sandwich

49 French Fries with
^ 8 ^  French Fries

Tator Tots . _ _
,  S 2 "

K w i k ' M a r c
D iam on d

Sh a m ro ck

Store hours:
Monday • Saturday 6 a.m. to 12 midnight 

Sunday 6 a.m. to 10 p.m.
V C R  tapes

changed every a w eeks
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Rachel’s
reviews

By Rachel O. Hall

Last week we looked "at the way 
parents learn to recognize and 
interpret their children’s feel­
ings. When children start coping 
with their feelings, they often feel 
in control of their lives. This leads 
to more productive problem 
solving in children.

Another positive result of 
recognizing and dealing with 
problems is that families learn to 
solve problems more effectively. 
When family members feel like 
someone is paying attention to 
their feelings and responding to 
their needs, there is a greater 
willingness to work at solving 
problems that may exist within 
the home.

Children often rebel when they 
feel that no one is paying 
attention to their needs. They 
may feel they have to go to 
extremes to get some of their 
needs met. However, when kids 
see parents paying attention to 
how they feel, there is often a 
willingness to compromise or at 
least talk things over - solutions 
are arrived at more quickly when 
one feels a solution includes him.

When parents begin to really 
“ hear” what their children are 
saying, family dynamics change. 
Often family interaction becomes 
much more pleasant. If children 
learn that they can contribute to 
the family conversation and 
trthers are really listening, there 
is an increased willingness to do 
the same. Using positive com- 
ppunication techniques also 
teaches children to listen for and 
pay attention to the needs of 
tfthers. If parents are using this 
form of communication, children 
biegin to use it, too, and they 
begin to listen for parent’s 
feelings, taking them into con­
sideration.

As kids learn to recognize and 
respect others’ feelings, they 
take more responsibility for their 
behavior. Paying attention to the 
feedback we get from others is 
extremely important, not only for 
children within the family but 
within other groups. It is a key 
element in helping kids find and 
establish meaningful friendships. 
This ability to communicate ef­
fectively one-on-one allows kids 
to form solid friendships within 
their families, within their peer 
groups and with other adults. It is 
this friendship support network 
that can help an adolescent 
weather rough times.

When kids learn to express 
themselves openly to their pa­
rents and parents listen, there is 
support, care and companionship 
- jbasic family functions. This 
lessens the risk of children at any 
age falling under negative in­
fluences.

There are a number of ways 
parents can learn to recognize 
feelings, many depend on the 
ages of the children involved. 
Wiih young children, play games 
that illustrate various feelings. 
Look at pictures in books and 
magazines and name the feel­
ings, or try to have the child

¥¥¥¥
¥¥
¥¥
¥

Norma’ s 
Country 
Kitchen

OPEN 10 to 10
closed on Monday

SPECIALS

^  fUESDA  r-Hamburgers 
^ ' and fries $2.25 i  

WEDNESDAY-IO p ie c e s ^

t of chicken $4.65 ^
THURSDA r-Steak finger-^ 

^  * basket $2.99 ^
^ ‘ fR I D A K-Fish and fries ^  

; with slaw $2.99 
' we also sell ice cream 

w ‘ cones and shakes « C

Maness 
I-IO Texaco

: ♦ GAS * GROCERIES ♦ ICE 
1-10 &Hwy. 163 

Full and self service

Ì
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Students take competency test College entry tests O ct22
i**

guess what the people are 
feeling. With older children, try 
turning the sound off on the TV 
during a soap opera and see if 
you can interpret what is going on 
by watching thè characters inter­
act. Name their feelings.

Many books on the market 
illustrating an increasing aware­
ness of feelings. It is a good idea 
to read these books. Read them to 
your kids - or have them read the 
books to you. As a result, you’ll 
be sharing an activity, as well as 
learning about understanding 
feelings.

UPCOMING EVENTS:

Sept. 26 - Beginner Sewing 
Course continues at High School 
Home Economics Building, 7:00 
p.m.

Sept. 30 - “ Families Working 
Together” series continues at 
Civic Center, 7:00 p.m. Topics 
will include: loneliness and bore­
dom, nutritious snacks and 
meals, and household chores.

Oct. 5 - 4-H Bake Sale at T&T 
Village Grocery and Thornton’s 
Supermarket begins at 11:00 a.m.

Fingerprinting and Identifica­
tion Card Clinic from 9-12 and 1-3 
at the Community Center. Spon­
sored by Crockett Co. Sheriff’s 
Department and Crockett 
Heights Extension Homemaker 
Club.

School
Cafeteria

Sept. 30 - Oct. 4 

MONDAY
Hamburger steak, buttered 

peas, garden fresh salad, sliced 
peaches, hot rolls

TUESDAY
Tacos, pinto beans, lettuce and 

tomatoes, pineapple tidbits

WEDNESDAY
Barbecue beef on bun, french 

fries, combination salad, corn­
flake cookies

THURSDAY
Corn chip pie, polka dot corn, 

creamy cole slaw, V2 orange, 
sliced bread

FRIDAY
Chicken nuggets, mashed po­

tatoes, green beans, fruit gelatin, 
hot rolls

As a result of the passage of 
House Bill 72 by the Texas 
Legislature, juniors in Texas high 
schools will be taking math and 
English language arts com­
petency tests on Tuesday and 
Wednesday, October 1 and 2. 
Passage of both sections of the 
TEAMS (Texas Educational As­
sessment of Minimum Skills) test 
will enable these students to 
become eligible to receive a high 
school diploma at the end of their 
twelfth grade year, provided that 
all graduation requirements have 
been met.

Students who fail one or both 
sections of the state-mandated 
examination will be requited to 
retake the failed section)s) of the 
test in May of 1986. If successful 
mastery has not been accom­
plished by that time, students 
will have two additional oppor­
tunities during their senior year 
to pass the TEAMS test before 
being denied a diploma in May, 
1987.

The mathematics section of the 
Exit Level TEAMS will consist of 
72 multiple-choice questions 
covering eighteen objectives. 
These objectives are: selecting a 
set of numbers that are correctly 
ordered from least to greatest; 
rounding numbers to a particular 
place value; identifying equiva­
lent fractions, decimals and per­
cents; converting numbers from 
exponential notation to standard 
notation; solving problems in­
volving addition/subtraction/ 
multiplication of fractions and 
mixed numbers; using the basic 
operations to solve decimal prob­
lems; solving problems involving 
addition of integers, solving word 
problems involving multiple 
operations of whole numbers, 
decimals, fractions and mixed 
numbers; solving word problems 
using formulas; solving word 
problems involving proportions; 
solving word problems involving 
percent; solving problems in­
volving metric/customary
measurements using the basic 
operations; solving word prob­
lems involving averages; solving 
word problems involving simple 
probability; using information 
from graphs and tables to solve 
word problems; solving problems 
involving geometric formulas; 
using geometric properties to 
solve problems involving 
geometric shapes; and, solving 
problems to determine the value 
of a variable.

The English language arts 
section of the Exit Level TEAMS 
will contain 72 multiple-choice 
questions over eighteen reading 
and writing objectives. These 
objectives are: identifying the 
main idea; using context to 
understand the meaning of 
words; using word structure to

Wagoner - Perry 
Motors, Inc. ,,

When W e’re Thru They Run Like New

24 Hour Wrecker Service

Billy Wogoner & Gene Perry 
— Owners —

392-5401
1 Barnhart Hwy.

(Hwy. 163 N.) Ozona

wm
VMmTuifMiItAim BtMfAU mSMANCt CO s

Sutton and
Crockett
Counties

Hablamos Español

LIFE AUTO FIRE 
HOME OWNERS 

GENERAL LIABILITY 
FARM/RANCH 

ESTATE PLANNING 
WORKERS COMP.

Sutton County Farm Bureau
Serving you to Serve Again
Bill Saveli - home 392-2062 

Sonora answering service 387-5231

4̂ '

C O N STR t,^

BRUCE MAYFIELD

Office Telephone 
392-2601 

■<!

General Dirt Contractors 
P.O. Box 1736 

Ozona, Texas 76943

Radio Equipped
.....

’> Q * \

Home Telephone 
392-2149 '

J.W. MOTOR PARTS CO

CflRQUEST
J.W . JOHNIGAN -OWNER

606 11th Street 
OZONA TEXAS 76943

CARQUEST:the right place to but buy auto parts 
Over 1700 CAROUEST Auto Parts Stores Coast to Coast.

identify words; identifying spe­
cific details; identifying a se­
quence of events; drawing logical 
conclusions; identifying the ap­
propriate reference source; using 
reference sources to locate infor­
mation; distinguishing between 
fact and opinion; analyzing lit­
erary selections; demonstrating 
knowledge of standard uses of 
capitalization; demonstrating 
knowledge of standard punc­
tuation; recognizing the correct 
spelling of commonly used 
words; demonstrating knowledge 
of correct English usage; demon­
strating the ability to distinguish 
complete sentences from frag­
ments and/or run-ons; recogniz­
ing sentences that best combine 
two related sentences; demon­
strating the ability to organize a 
written communication; and, 
demonstrating the ability to 
proofread a written communica­
tion.

All juniors in Texas public 
schools are required to take the 
Exit Level TEAMS except those 
students who have been formally 
evaluated and determined to 
have a physical, mental or other 
impariment which entitles the 
student to receive special educa­
tion and related services.

Ozona school officials expect to 
receive test results by November 
1 , and students will be notified as 
soon as possible. Remedial in­
struction will be provided to those 
students who fail either the 
mathematics or the English 
language arts section of the state 
test.

This fall the nearly 1.5 million 
students across the United States 
who take the Preliminary 
Scholastic Aptitude T est/ 
National Merit Scholarship Quali­
fying Test (PSAT/NMSQT) will 
have a special opportunity to 
familiarize themselves with the 
testing format also used on the 
Scholastic Aptitude Test (SAT).

This year, the PSAT/NMSQT 
will be offered Tuesday, October 
22, at Ozona High School. 
Students need to see Mr. Wil­
liams about taking the test. The 
cost will be $5.00.

Through the PSAT/NMST, 
11th grade students are selected 
for the National Merit Scholar­
ship Qualifying Program, which 
enables talented students to 
compete for scholarships. His­
panic students are considered for 
the National Hispanic Scholar 
Awards Program, funded 
through a $2.1 million grant from 
the Andrew W. Mellon Founda­
tion.

In addition, students can use 
the test as a guide to see how 
they ranked nationally among 
other students.

As preparation for the 100- 
minute, two-part test, students 
receive Student Bulletin con­
taining a complete sample test 
with an answer key and scoring

instructions.
After taking the actual test, 

students will receive a booklet. 
About Your PSAT/NMSQT' 
Scores, a descriptive explanation 
of test results. Students will also 
be able to compare their indi­
vidual answers with the correct 
answers by consulting the Report 
o f Student Answers, another 
valuable guide. Actual test book­
lets will also be made available to 
allow students to spot mistakes 
and work out answers correctly.

The College Board provides 
additional services for counselors 
and school personnel to better 
understand and interpret PSAT/ 
NMSQT scores to students and 
parents. These services include 
summaries of student answers, 
profiles of academic character­
istics and career interests of 
students who have taken the test, 
and a publication for inclusion in 
the regular guidance program.

Character is not 
gift - it is victory.

an inherited

Silence may be golden, 
often as not it’s guilt.

but

4c4:4c!|!
Trouble comes from things that 

we let slip from our lips rather 
than what we let slip through our 
fingers.

Notice of 
REWARD

I am offering ,

$500 Reward
for apprehension and con­
viction of guilty parties to 
every theft of livestock in 
Crockett County-except that no 
officer of Crockett County may 
claim the reward.

SHERIFF  ̂ CROCKETT CO.
B iA y M m s _

Ozona Wool 
& Mohair

2 0 % off
F ertilizer

1 0% off
on Pipe 

F ittings

We believe your Government payments are 
important to you and that you deserve to 
receive them in the safest, most reliable way 
possible. Some of the ways Direct Deposit 
helps you are:

•Eliminates a special trip to deposit your 
check.

•Ends worry about your check being lost or 
stolen.

•Allows you to be away from home without 
the worry of your check sitting unprotected 
in your mailbox.

•Begins earning interest immediately if you 
have an interest-bearing account.

•Ensures that your money is available to you 
at the opening of business on the same day 
your check would arrive in the mail.

Just take your next check to CROCKETT 
COUNTY NATIONAL BANK. We will 
answer any questions you may have and help 
you complete the form.

•Within 60 to 90 days, your payments will 
begin going directly to your personal 
account.

•Remember, it is still important that you 
notify your Government agency of any 
address change, since they will still be 
sending important information about your 
payments to your home.

It’s that easy. And after all, you’ve got it 
coming.

BANKING HOURS 
Lobby 9:00 a.m. - 3:00 p.m. 

Drive-in 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 
Monday - Friday

Ozona, Texas 
392-3745 /  392-5829

FDIC

ask about direct deposit
___  of Government

Checks...
\  Did you know you can have your Social
\  Security or other U S Government checks

\  sent to our bank and deposited  
\  immediately in your account? Ask about 

\  this convenient service today.

•Safe*Convenieiit«U.S.Goveriiinetit Recommended

Do you receive a check from any 
of these government programs

Social Security
Supplemental Security Income 

Civil Service Retirement 
Railroad Retirement 

Veterans Compensation and Pension
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Crockett County 
National Bank

Your Bank of Personal Service
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Whites celebrate birthdays
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By Cynthia Harrell Hodges

Mr. and Mrs. Frank James 
have returned from a trip in their 
mobile home to Kerrville. The 
James have traveled throughout 
the United States and are mem­
bers of many mobile home travel 
clubs.

Orlando Valadez of San Angelo 
was in Ozona recently visiting his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Valadez, and his brother and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Robert 
Valadez and Brian.

Mr. and Mrs. Cleophas Cooke 
have returned from a trip to 
Austin to visit their grand­
daughter and family, Jennifer 
and Wade Beasley and baby 
Zachery Adam who arrived Sep­
tember 6.

Mr. and Mrs. John Childress, 
R. A. Harrell and Cynthia 
Hodges attended the Missouri- 
Texas game in Austin Saturday.

Jim Jenkins of Amarillo has 
been here visiting friends of 
many years, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Hyde. The Hydes did not travel to 
Amarillo as previously reported.

Former resident, Mrs. Tennis 
(Claudie Butler) Craighton of 
Cristoval was an Ozona visitor 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Valadez 
celebrated their 43rd anniversary 
September 21. The were married 
in;Del Rio September 21, 1942.

Bob Faulkner underwent sur­
gery in San Angelo Tuesday. He 
returned home late Wednesday.

Congratulations to Max and 
Pearletta Morris who celebrated 

. their wedding anniversary this 
week.

Mrs. Dario Porras Sr. is a 
patient in Hudspeth Memorial 
Hospital in Sonora this week.

Visiting Mrs. Cecil Hubbard 
this week have been her daughter 
and family, Joy and Lee Cren- 
welge of Midland, their son, 
Phillip Crenwelge of Harper, and 
Mrs. H ubbard’s great-grand­
daughters, Holly Thomas of 
Midland, Kristan and Nicole 
Saunders of Fredericksburg.

Rev. and Mrs. Ken Eppler will 
celebrate their tenth wedding 
anniversary Friday.

T.K. O’Bryant has returned 
home after a stay in a San Angelo 
hospital.

Two Ozona families will be 
departing this week for new 
homes. Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Jones are moving to San Angelo, 
and Mr. and Mrs. John Parks go 
to their new home in Round Rock.

Janie and Jack Riggs have 
returned to their ranch south of 
Ozona after a recent trip to 
Oklahoma.

Jessie and Ted White cele­
brated their 79th and 80th 
birthdays Saturday night, Sep­
tember 21, at the Pandale Com­
munity Center. Hosting the oc­
casion were son and daughter-in- 
law Mark and Patsy White of San 
Angelo and Glenda Masters, 
exchange student from Australia 
who is living with the Mark 
Whites and attending Central 
High School.

Birthday cake and ice cream 
were served following the barbe­
cue supper which was catered by 
David and Kay Cooke of Ozona 
and was enjoyed out under the 
trees. Visiting and reminiscing 
were'the order of the evening as 
many old friends from school 
teaching days in Ozona were 
present as well as ranching 
friends and family members.

Among the approximately 60 
people who were present during 
the evening, those from out of 
town included: Mr. and Mrs. W. 
0. Walker, Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Kuhn and Mr. and Mrs. Mark 
Kuhn and Jennifer of Grandfalls, 
Dr. and Mrs. J. Ray Martin, 
Coleman; Mr. and Mrs. Edgar 
Walker, Tickfaw, Louisiana; Mar­
lon Barber, Big Spring; Harva 
Cooper, Sonora; Vi Brewster, San 
Angelo; Mr. and Mrs. Guinn 
Caruthers, Paradise; Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Skiles and Vashti 
Skiles, Langtry; Earl Malone, 
Robbie Nell Malone and Jessica 
McCrary, Sheffield; and Ada 
Russell of Midland.

Attending from Ozona were 
Mr. and Mrs. Huey Ingram, 
Lowell and Lucille Littleton, 
Norma and Bill Carson, Earline 
and Vernon Jones, Georgia and 
L. D. Kirby, Herbert Kunkel, 
Ethel and Buster Miller, Ginger,

Paul and Paul IV Perner, Penn, 
Lara Sue, Leana and Whitney 
Baggett, Henry and Wanda Sel­
lars, Lane and Sherry Scott.

Pandale residents joining the 
celebration were Josephine and 
Henry Mills, Jr., Martha and 
Terry Gries, Sue and Larry 
Arledge, Opal and Tom Everett, 
Lela Bunger, Tanna Bixby, 
Myrtle and Carl Malone, Sr.

Auxiliary has final 
meeting o f 1986
The Crockett County Hospital 

and Care Center Auxiliary will 
hold it’s last scheduled meeting 
for 1985 on Tuesday, October 1, 
at 3:00 in the Day Room of the 
Care Center. Officers for the 1986 
year will be elected, and plans for 
1986 will be made.

A report on the Care-A-Van 
project will be available along 
with the Hospital Life Line 
telephone system.

“ Everyone is invited to join us 
and help us improve the well­
being of our residents,’’ says Jo 
Davidson. Local organizations are 
urged to appoint a representative 
to meet with the auxiliary so more 
local participation will be avail­
able.

New members are always 
welcome. The group meets three 
times a year, and dues are only 
$1.50.

Arts and Crafts Guild 
names new officers

Kimball Saddlery
Hwy 290W

Fort Stockton t ̂
Local information, Call 392-3158 u

•Custom Built Saddles . . / j  ;
-------

»Repair Saddles and i i
All Riding and T ^ ‘ ,

, Working Tack ! % 1 t'!
it- .T a c k  ^

PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE SERVICES

TONY’S
QUICK LUBE ANILTIDY CAR 

1206 AVE- D-
OZONA, TEXAS 76943

o il  change-lube iob-car w a sh
392-3857 F rank  T am bunga

The Crockett County Arts and 
Crafts Guild held its organiza­
tional meeting Tuesday, Sep­
tember 17, at the Civic Center. 
New officers and committee 
chairmen were chosen for the 
coming year. Two events coming 
up this fall were also decided 
upon.

The Guild will sponsor a cake 
walk booth at the Halloween 
Carnival, with proceeds going to 
buy children’s books for the new 
Crockett County Library. The 
Guild’s second annual Christmas 
Fair will be held November 9 at 
the 4-H Barn. Proceeds from the 
Guild’s booth have not been 
decided upon as of yet. The Guild 
will offer booths free of charge 
again to the Boy Scouts and Girl 
Scouts and operate a booth for 
the Care Center. Anyone or 
group interested in obtaining a 
booth should contact Betty King 
at 392-3840 for an application.

The Guild also has a member­
ship drive under way. Anyone 
interested in arts and crafts who 
lives or works within Crockett 
County is eligible for member­
ship. Crockett County Arts and 
Crafts Guild is a non-profit or­
ganization founded to promote 
arts and crafts within Crockett 
County. The Guild is not af­
filiated with the County of 
Crockett in any way, nor is it part 
of any branch of government 
ofiFice. A portion of all dues and 
fees collected will be put back 
into the community by way of 
donations. Crockett County Arts 
and Crafts Guild does not dis­
criminate against any member- 
applicant regardless of age, sex, 
race or creed.

Independent 
Beauty Consultant 

Sara Hignight 
392-2471

COSMETICS

Crockett County Arts and 
Crafts Guild was designed to 
assist the community in the 
promotion of cultural activities. It 
recognizes the need and desire to 
work with the community leaders 
in a spirit of full cooperation. In 
order to facilitate this, Crockett 
County Arts and Crafts Guild will 
have an Advisory Board consist­
ing of three members; one 
County government official, one 
business person belonging to the 
Chamber of Commerce and one 
member-at-large. The Executive 
Board of Crockett County Arts 
and Crafts Guild will work closely 
with the Advisory Board to 
provide the community an arts 
and crafts guild the citizens of 
Crockett County can be proud of. 
Anyone interested in becoming a 
member may call Jacquie King 
and 392-3651 or Nelda Hopkins at 
392-3461.

New officers for the coming 
year are: Jacquie King, chair­
man; Nelda Hopkins, co- 
chairman; Billy Kiser, secretary; 
Betty Bullard, treasurer. Com­
mittee chairmen are: Mary 
Skains, telephone; Donna 
Snyder, news letter and exhibits; 
Betty King, applications; Betty ' 
Bullard, publicity; Billy Kiser, ' 
Guild booths; Jacquie King, 
Winter Show chairman.

#
Please

If you have guests, a party, 
wedding anniversary or go on a 
trip, please let us know.

Send the information to The 
Crockett County News, P. 0. Box 
1963, Ozona, TX 76943 or phone 
392-5230.

^ ^ a ^ o s a

392-2726
1206 Ji/e. g .
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The Circle Bar Restaurant
and

JoseTobar 
are now ready to serve you with those

very important
parties, banquets, weddings, etc.

Come join us for our daily Specials

Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday
Hamburger Steak Spanish steak Bar-b-que plate Chicken fry Catfish special

French fries Refried beans & rice Potato salad French fries French fries

Salad bar Two flour tortillas
Pinto beans

Salad bar Salad bar

Coffee or tea
Onions Pickles 
Dessert Coffee or tea Coffee or tea

- $4̂ ^
Coffee or tea

$4“ $4“



PAGE 10 THE CROCKETT COUNTY NEWS

Buy, Sell, Trade, Save! 
in the Classifieds

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 25, 1985

392-5230
For Sale

Carpet for sale: 392-2283 after 
5. _______________  Ip lS

For sale at The News: bubble 
pack mailing envelopes.
‘ For Sale: Snare drum in
excellent condition. Call 392-3278 
after 5.______  ^

Ink cartridges for caligraphy 
pens for sale at The News.

For Sale: TRS 80 Model 4 with 
cassette and programs. $450. 
392-5888._________________^ 9

PREVIOUSLY OWNED GUNS 
Cash or Trade 

No Tax 
392-2490

Ruger single six 22LR/22Mag. 
Like new - blued - $150.

Ruger Security Six stainless, 
.357 mag. - $250.

Ruger Speed Six stainless, .357 
mag. - $250.

Iver Johnson U. S. Carbine, 
.22LR w/2 clips - $100.

For Sale: structural pipes and 
sucker rods. 392-5020. tf8

Real Estate
For sale: good office space or 

shop potential with good location 
behind Westerman Drug. For 
information, call Jerry at 
392-2533 or Louis at 392-2784 
after 6 p.m.________________

For Sale - Country Club living. 
4 bedroom, 3 bath, custom 
paneled den with fireplace, large 
playroom, custom drapes, 
fenced-in swimming pool. Shown 
by appointment. 392-5049 tf8

MAKE OFFER!

MUST SELL NOW!
3 bedroom, 2 bath, 4 yrs 
Site-built home. Owner 
carry part of equity. Closing 
costs, fees pd., will buy 
points. See 305 Rugged Rd. 
behind high school. Call 
392-3634 or 303-824-7442.

old.
may

& ID #1 on Tuesday, October 8, 
1985, for the following coverages: 
Texas Multi-Peril, Workers Com­
pensation & Automobile Lia­
bility. Please come by the water 
office at 511 11th Street, Ozona 
for details. '
_________________________^ 3

NOTICE

Notice is hereby given that the 
County Budget for the year of 
1986 was adopted September 9, 
1985, by the Commissioners 
Court o f Crockett County and is 
available for inspection at the 
Courthouse offices of County 
Clerk, County Judge and County 
Auditor. Any interested citizen 
may inspect budget at any time 
during regular office hours.

A. 0. FIELDS
Crockett County Commissioners 

Court

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

THE COMMISSIONERS COURT 
OF CROCKETT COUNTY, 
TEXAS will receive sealed bids 
until 11:00 AM October 14, 1985 
at which time bids will be opened 
and read for the purchase of the 
following:

ITEM - I One New 1986 1 Ton 
Truck, Cab & Chassis

ITEM II One New 1986 1 Ton 
Truck, Cab and Chassis

ITEM III One New 1986 V2 Ton 
Pickup Truck

Bidding instructions and spe­
cifications may be obtained by 
contacting the County Auditor 
Office, Courthouse Annex, 
Ozona, Texas

Adult computer class
A six week adult education 

computer science course is being 
taught by Lane Scott, high school 
computer science teacher in the 
Heritage Building computer lab 
room at 7 p.m. Tuesday and 
Wednesday nights.

“ Computers are important to­
day because this is the way we 
deal with information,” Scott 
said. All information in the world 
doubles at an increasingly fast 
rate--every seven and one half

years. “ We are in the age of an 
information revolution. The com­
puter is the tool to handle vast 
amounts of information.

The course will introduce 
students to word processing, 
spread sheets, data base man­
agement systems, telecommuni­
cations, products and ideas in 
programming. Between 12 to 15 
persons are currently taking the 
course.

Community Center Board has guest
The regular monthly meeting 

of the Ozona Community Center 
board met last Thursday night at 
the Community Center, Marilyn 
Cox, chairman of the board 
reported.

Dr. George Ricker, district 
superintendent of the San Angelo

district of the United Methodist 
Church, attended the meeting 
and said “ he looked forward to 
working with the board.”

The Community Center is 
currently home to the Tinyville 
and Kiddie Klub pre-school pro­
grams.

Johnny Childress 
REAL ESTATE

RESIDENTIAL - RANCHES 
LOTS - ACREAGE 

COMMERCIAL
CHANDLERDALE WEST LOTS 

Owner financing available

392-3634 392-5051
1102 AveE OZONA

X I Sigma Omega Chapter

Dick Kirby 
County Auditor 
Crockett County 2cl4

Mobile Homes
1970 Celebrity mobile home., 

14x70. Excellent condition. Ap­
pliances included. 392-2334. 9 
a.m. to5p.m . tf/1

^ Garage Sale
7 Saturday, Sept. 28 

8:00-?
512 Ave. E

‘ ‘ ' Kids’ clothes, some furniture, 
household items. Icl4

M iscellaneous
Second Grade Girl Scout leader 

needed. Call Leslie Wilson. 392- 
3417.___________________ ^ 5

Building, remodeling, paint­
ing, cement work, roofing. Clyde 
“ Red” Myatt. Call after 5 p.m. 
392-2602.___________ tf3

Part-time job needed. Call 
392-3985.________________2pl4

POLLY’S CAKES

Decorated cakes, cookies and 
cupcakes for all occasions. Re- ■ 
member Halloween parties. 
Wedding cakes large and small. 
392-3129. 211 Mesquite. 3cl2

Fire guards and righ-of-ways 
rmaintainer or dozer cut. 392-5020
_________________  m

CUSTOM CAST BULLETS 
We CAST’em 

You SHOOT ’em 
Lead Bullets -  Only 

Sized & Lubed 
Your choice of caliber 
from available moulds 

- ; $5/$6 -  100 ct.
> -  “ REB BULLETS” 

392-2490

Stanley Home Products needs 3 
ladies to work from now until 
Christmas, parties not necessary. 
For appointment call Ann Shaw 
392-2548.

BIDS NOTICE

Bids for insurance will be 
accepted by Crockett County WC

OZONA 
BUTANE

Propane 
S^es and 
Services 
3 9 2 -3 7 *4

The Xi Sigma Omega chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi met on 
Monday, September 23 at 7:30 
p.m. in the home of Barbara 
Wallace. After a business meet­
ing, the program was presented 
by Mrs. Judy Sims, cosmetology 
teacher at Oz6na High School. 
Mrs. Sims discussed the cosme­
tology program, benefits of cos­
metology careers, requirements 
for course completion, and her 
impressions of the new program. 
She also gave information about 
home-made beauty aids and tips 
for hair care and make-up.

Members attending the meet­
ing were Barbara Burger, Arlene 
Clayton, Bobbie Fatout, Nancy 
Hale, Brenda Newton, Tommie 
Pena-Alfaro, Debbie Phillips, 
Donna Sanders, Donna Snyder,

Jesse’s.
Tire Repair 

Shop

Barbara Wallace, Jeanne Well­
man, and Sherry York. Guests 
were Marsha Cannon, Janice 
Graham, Betty Koerth, and Dana 
McAllister.

Jr, High 4-H Meeting
The Ozona Junior High 4-H 

Club met Monday, September 16, 
in the junior high cafeteria. There 
were 25 members and one adult 
leader present.

Members made posters ad­
vertising National 4-H Week to 
be put up in town. The next club 
meeting will be Monday, Novem­
bers 4, at the junior high 
cafeteria. Mrs. Rachel Hall will 
give a program on method 
demonstrations.

Susan Pullen, reporter __

W-_JACOBY 
REAL ESTATE

Homes-Lots-Commercial 
Ranch Properties 

392-3059 401 Hillcrest

School BuUetin Board
ALL SCHOOLS 

Oct. 2 - Pictures 10:30 a.m. Bus leaves at 7:30 
a.m.

HIGH SCHOOL Sept. 26 - 7th grade vs.
Sept. 27 - Ozona vs. Stanton, 8 Stanton, 5 p.m., here 

P‘m. here 8th grade vs. Stanton, 6:30,
Pep rally 3:35 - 3:50, Boys’ here

J* V. vs. Water Valley, there, 
7:30 p.m.

Sept. 28 - J. V. vs. Stanton, there.

Corner Ave. H & 5th St. 
Phone 392-3473

ROUSTABOUT AND PAINT SERVICE 
BRUSH CONTROL - ROAD REPAIR 

BACKHOE SERVICE

Double C Enterprises
P.O BOX 332 ■ OZONA, TEXAS 76943 

FULLY INSURED

BLACK DIRT 
CALICHE 

FILL
Day or Night

915-392-2858 915-392-5020

CLEAR RIGHT OF VI/AYS 
MOVE MOBILE HOMES 
LOCATION CLEAN UP

‘ ' I f "  y  7 mm,

.; MOORE O lt  COMPANY
101 Ave. E*

* ’ Local diatribntor of
^, '.ir Compressor oils -A Diesel 

Motor oil
j ; ' if  Methanol

Phone 392-3010

if  Gasolines

'í' /lUIOMRIS ^
Crockett Automotive

1202 Ave. E., Box 518 
Ozona, Texas 76943 

(915)392—3159

Good Supply Parts 
Overnight Service

6f
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«hen you deal with

Ozona National Bank

Since 1905
Ozona, Texas 76943 

Phone 392-2676, 392-2694, 392-3787

For tim ely  w eather rep)orts eall 392-3751
Member FDIC


