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“A/F  
TURN ”

B y
Carol Ellis
WE ARE ALL anxiously awaiting 
the coming of the “ kinder, gentler 
nation” which has been promised 
to us by our new president-elect 
George Bush.

It wasn’t a landslide or even a 
mandate, but it was a substantial 
win for the Republican ticket. 
Grassroots Americans went to the 
voting booths and said “ We don’t 
want liberal left-wing folks 
residing in our White House.”

The big question posed at the 
beauty shop has been “ What sort 
of First Lady is Barbara Bush 
going to be?” It has been a long 
time since we have had a solid, 
down-to-earth, motherly-type First 
Lady along the lines of Mamie 
Eisenhower or Bess Truman.

So, good-bye to the anorexic 
model ladies with the painted-on 
smiles and the designer duds. 
Welcome to Big Mamma Bush! 
She’ll do a lot for the self-image of 
many of us who are bustling 
around with several extra pounds 
on our bustle.

With that said, I don’t care to 
hear anymore about politics for 
quite a long time. We begin now to 
look forward to the coming 
holiday season. Shop till you drop! 
A woman’s place is in the mall! 
Etc., etc.

Last year, about this time, I 
thought I had to buy a particular 
board game for a family friend, 
and so I ventured into one of those 
big city gigantic-size toy stores. 
What an experience! Stacks of 
games reached from floor to 
ceiling and I can’t see up that high 
with these bifocals. A tiny 
automated TV game show host 
who seemed to be a cross between 
Bert Convey and Alex Trebeck, 
began trying to sell me on an 
electronic game set costing 
hundreds of dollars.

In the next aisle, a robot was 
tootling up and down, making 
beeping noises and bumping into 
the shoppers. Further into the 
store, two stuffed bears were 
actually conversing with each 
other. Out loud! Honest!

Remember how delighted we 
used to be with a doll that closed 
her eyes and said “ Mama” or a toy 
truck that didn’t do anything 
except roll along the floor when 
you pushed it?

Today would probably be an 
excellent time to invest in some 
stock with a company which 
produces batteries such as 
Duracell, Eveready or Energizer. 
Their sales around Christmas time 
must be phenomenal. And if you 
simply must venture into a toy 
store, be sure to take a friend along 
for protection from all those 
electronic things.

A lot of people are choosing to 
avoid those nerve-wracking 
Christmas shopping trips by 
ordering gifts from the many 
colorful catalogues which you’ve 
been getting in the mail almost 
every day lately. The variety is 
endless.

Shopping by catalogue is a bit 
more expensive by the time you 
pay the shipping charges. Also 
there is some risk involved since a 
particularly popular item could be 
sold out and back-ordered or never 
delivered at all. Orders placed after 
Thanksgiving are pretty chancy, so 
catalogue shopping requires a 
great deal of planning ahead.

Of course, a super alternative to 
all of the above would be to shop 
at home first before trying the 
malls or the catalogues. Chances 
are, one of the local stores will 
have just the item you’ve been 
looking for. The Friona 
Merchants’ Christmas Give-Away 
will have six lucky local winners on 
December 21. Why not give it a 
try?

School Sets 
Holiday Break

Friona schools will dismiss at 
2:45 p.m. Wednesday, November 
23 for the Thanksgiving holidays 
Thursday and Friday, November 
24-25.

School will resume at its regular 
time on Monday, November 28.
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Grid Race Is 
In Final Stages

With two weeks remaining in the 
Friona Star’s football contest, the 
race for the grand prize is 
beginning to get heated.

After last week’s contest, Eddie

Suicide Is 
Ruled Here

The death of a 24-year-old man 
found dead in his pickup Monday 
morning has been ruled suicide, 
following extensive investigation.

Friona Chief of Police Lloyd 
Niece said that Roberto Castaneda 
Villarreal was found dead by 
police officers after being tipped 
by businessmen Ed Bailey and 
W.A. Turner Monday morning 
when they opened for business in 
the 500 block of Main Street.

Villarreal was in the seat of his 
pickup in front of the old hotel 
building, with a gunshot wound to 
the head.

Niece said that Villarreal had 
been shot once with a 25-calibre 
bullet that went through his head 
and then shattered the window on 
the driver’s side of the pickup.

It first had appeared that 
someone might have shot 
Villarreal through the pickup 
window, but investigating officers 
felt sure the suicide ruling was 
correct. Villarreal was found to 
have powder wounds. The bullet 
entered his head from the right 
side, and exited on the left side, 
according to an autopsy report.

An autopsy was performed by 
Dr. Ralph Erdman, Amarillo 
pathologist.

Niece said that Villarreal 
apparently had broke up with his 
girl friend. He reportedly had told 
friends and relatives earlier that if 
he lost his girl friend, he guessed he 
would “just kill himself.”

The Friona Police Chief said 
that Villarreal had visited a brother 
and sister-in-law at the hotel after 

• midnight on Sunday, leaving at 
about 1 a.m. He reportedly was 
“ very intoxicated” at the time.

The brother and sister-in-law 
assumed that Villarreal had left to 
go home.

Mann of San Angelo continues to 
lead, but ' the standings have 
tightened up for the top 14 
contestants or so.

Mann leads the pack with a 
score of 158. Tied for second place 
are Jerry Bentley and Charlie 
Morgan with scores of 157. Jack 
Clark and Dianne Morgan are next 
with scores of 156.

Mitchell Smiley is next with a 
score of 155. Next comes Mark 
Neill at 153. Tom Johnson and 
J.O. Warren are tied at 152; Alex 
Guerra and Vicky Moss are at 151, 
Jackie Morgan, Joy Morton and 
Donnie McDonald stand at 150.

With 40 points yet to be earned, 
it’s still anyone’s race.

The scores nosedived in last 
weekend’s contest, and the leader’s 
score dived along with the rest, 
enabling the standings to tighten 
up somewhat.

Mark Zachary of Lubbock was 
the only contestant entering the 
eleventh weekly contest to pick 15 
of the 20 contest games correctly. 
He won the weekly prize of $10 
cash hands down.

Ten contestants had scores of 
14, and from this group Tom 
Johnson and Mai Manchee of 
Hereford tied for second and 
third, when both had the exact tie­
breaker score on their entries.

Other contestants correctly 
picking 14 games were R.L. 
Blakely, Robert Brandon, Rick 
Carr, Raymond Delgado, Mike 
Meyer, Joe Tongate, James 
Warren III and Wayne Amstutz.

Thirteen contestants correctly
(Continued on Page 6)

TOM JOHNSON

City Manager Says 
Water Supply Safe
-City Manager Beelee Goodwin 

said this week that although the 
city is being required to notify 
water customers that a sampling of 
city water submitted to the State 
Department of Health showed a 
bacterial content, that the city’s 
water supply is totally safe.

Goodwin said that the bacteria- 
laden sampling was contained in a 
sample drawn in September from 
an outdoor hydrant.

“ The samples are taken on a 
monthly basis, from random 
locations. The employee who 
regularly takes the samples was 
gone, and a substitute drew the
sample that month. Sometimes it’s 
tricky, especially with outside 
faucets, to get a water sample 
without collecting bacteria along 
with it,” the city manager said.

Since the bad sample was 
reported, the city has recently gone

back on two consecutive days 
and drawn samples from the same 
faucet, and both have tested out 
fine.

However, due to a state 
Department of Health require­
ment, all city water customers 
must now be notified by first class 
mail regarding the sample which 
contained bacteria.

Bank Open 
Late Wed.

Friona State Bank will be open 
Wednesday, November 23 until 6 
p.m., due to the Thanksgiving 
holiday on Thursday.

The bank is usually open until 6 
p.m. on Thursdays, but is moving 
that day up next week due to the
holiday.

WIND DAMAGE....The Hub Storage facility, located on 
Highway 60, sustained roof damage in Tuesday’s wind. 
One of the structures was completely unroofed by the 70 
mph winds.

ALL-REGIONAL....Twelve members of the Chieftain High School band 
earned all-regional chairs at the tryouts last Saturday. Standing from the left 
are Holly Snead, Marie Davila, Nathan Brockman, James Warren, Mindy 
Johnson and Michael Mann. Seated are Mark Madrid, James Thomas, Ismael 
Espino, Chad Beavers and Lory Tannahill.

Windstorm Causes 
Damage Locally

The Friona area was buffeted by 
an unusual late fall windstorm on 
Tuesday. Winds which gusted up 
to 70 miles per hour caused 
considerable damage in the area.

This area seemed to be the 
starting point for the system that 
spawned killer tornadoes 
beginning in Arkansas, Oklahoma 
and throughout the Midwest 
during the day.

The worst damage noted in 
Friona was to the Hub Storage 
facility on Highway 60, where the 
sheet steel roof of the storage 
facility on the west was uprooted

and laid upside down draped 
across the twin structure to the 
east.

Otherwise, there was damage 
reported to a trailer house located 
west of town near Herring 
Implement Co., and a large tree 
limb was blown down on North 
Walnut Street.

At Altus, Oklahoma on 
Tuesday, a cotton module at a gin 
caught fire and was blown into an 
adjacent residential district, 
causing 18 homes to be lost. 
Firemen battling the fire were 
hospitalized for smoke inhalation.

Community Service
The annual Community 

Thanksgiving service, sponsored 
by the Friona Ministerial Alliance, 
will be held Sunday, November 
at 7 p.m. at St. Teresa’s Catholic 
Church.

The call to worship will be given 
by the Calvary Baptist Church.

The welcome will be given by 
Joe Mejia of St. Teresa’s Catholic 
Church.

A special number, “ Great is Thy 
Faithfullness,” will be sung by the 
First Baptist Church Senior 
Adults. “ Sanctuary” will be 
presented by Rev. and Mrs. Leland 
Hart of the Assembly of God 
Church.

Guy Patterson of the Union 
Congregational Church will

present the Litany.
Special music will be presented 

by the Community Choir, and a 
group from Gethsemane Baptist 
Church, First Baptist Church 
ladies ensemble and First United 
Methodist Church group.

Congregational songs will 
include “ Come We That Love the 
Lord,”  “ Now Thank We All Our 
God,” “ We Gather Together,” 
and “ Bind Us Together.”

Scripture readings will be given 
by Father Tm Dran of St. Teresa’s 
Catholic Church, Rev. Tommy 
Ewing of First United Methodist 
Church and Rev. Vergil Ichtertz of 
Calvary Baptist Church.

Blood Bank CamPa'8n

Tuesday night also brought the 
first heavy freeze to the area for 
the season, when temperatures 
dropped to a low of 21 degrees. 
The low was also established for 
Wednesday since the reading at 8 
a.m. that day was 22 degrees.

The low temperature reading 
called an end to the growing 
season, since most plants had not 
been killed by earlier readings 
which barely dropped below the 
freezing point.

The killing freeze date of 
November 16 makes it two years in 
a row for a late freeze. The first 
freeze of 1987 was recorded on 
November 10.

The harvesting of the area’s 
cotton crop, which had been 
delayed waiting for a general 
killing freeze, now is expected to 
gain momentum. Jerry Butman of 
Friona Farmers Co-op Gin said 
that up until the freeze the cotton 
that had been received was still 
somewhat green. “ This should get 
it ready,” he said.

Maize harvest in the area 
likewise should be quickened by 
the freeze.

* * * *
TEMPERATURES

Date Hi-Low
Saturday, November 12 70-33
Sunday, November 13 62-33
Monday, November 14 76-44
Tuesday, November 15 78-39
Wednesday, November 16 52-21
Thursday, November 17 53-22
Friday, November 18 61-29

Precipitation: .04 inches
November 15.

Sets Visit
Coffee Memorial Blood Center 

will be at Friona State Bank 
Community Room on 
Monday, November 21 from 3-7 
p.m.

There is a greater need for blood 
during the holiday season and the 
regular donors are usually not 
available at this time of year.

We have had several people 
from our area who have used 
blood recently and we need to 
replace those uses.

There is no danger of getting 
AIDS from blood donations. 
Needles and bags are used only 
one time and discarded.

Please come to the Bank and 
help with our blood drive.

Bank Invites
Business
Ornaments

Friona State Bank has 
announced that it is inviting local 
business establishments to bring a 
personalized ornament to the 
bank, to hang on the large 
Christmas tree in the lobby.

All businesses are asked to bring 
an ornament to the bank by 
November 30.

A a ^  tm  a  j  November 15.

A t  Star Deadline
Friona’s United Way campaign 

had raised $5,246.00 as of 
Thursday, November 17, 
according to David Barnett, 
chairman of the board for the 
U.W.

This amounts to 41.27 per cent, 
Barnett said.

“ We are pleased with the drive 
so far, but we need all of the 
workers to complete their 
assignments and return their 
packets,” Barnett said.

Will Be Early
The Friona Star’s deadline will 

be moved up a day next week, due 
to the Thanksgiving holiday.

All news items and advertise­
ments must be turned in to the 
paper by Wednesday morning, in 
order to be published.

Subscribers should receive their 
papers at the regular time on 
Saturday, November 26.

HONORED....Iona Renner was honored by Hi-Pro Feeds 
this week with a reception on the occasion of her 20th 
anniversary with the company. Hi-Pro officials Bill 
Stovell, left, and Jack Hamil, present Mrs. Renner with an 
engraved silver tray.

i
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Squaws ] 
F renship

Prairie A cres 
Party Line

The Friona High School Squaws 
dropped a 53-35 decision to 
Frenship in their opening game of 
the 1988-89 season here Tuesday.

The visitors came up with a 
pressing defense in the third 
quarter to hold the Squaws 
scoreless for the entire quarter, 
and blew open what had been a 
close game.

The Squaws had held the lead 
for most of the first half. With 
Sindy Preston and Cindy Ureste 
each scoring a pair of field goals, 
the Friona girls held a 10-8 lead at 
the end of the first quarter.

Individual baskets by Sindy 
Preston, Dona Auburg and

Brandy Ray, and four free throws 
by Susie Preston helped the 
Squaws to a 20-20 tie against the 
Lubbock girls at the half.

Then came the third quarter and 
the defense which held Friona 
scoreless for the entire quarter. 
Sindy Preston sustained an ankle 
injury, and sat out most of the 
quarter, and this didn’t help 
Friona’s cause.

Miss Preston came back in the 
game in the fourth quarter, and 
connected on five field goals-one 
from three-point range, to pace the 
Squaws in a comeback effort.

The rally came up short, 
although Friona outscored the 
visitors 15-11 in the final quarter.

Sindy Preston’s 17 points led 
Friona’s scoring. Miss Ureste 
scored eight, and Susie Preston six.

JV Squaws 
Fall, 35-33 SQUAWS 10 10 0 15-35

Frenship 8 12 22 11-53
Cindy Ureste 3-2-8; Sindy 

Preston 7-1 *-17; Dona Auburg 1- 
0-2; Brandy Ray 1-0-2; Susie 
Preston 0-6-6; Julie Howard 0-0-0; 
Kenda Atwell 0-0-0.

School Lunch 
Menu

WEEK OF NOVEMBER 21-23
MONDAY-Hot dogs, baked 

beans, buns, fruit and milk.
TUESDAY—Steak fingers, 

green beans, potatoes, gravy, hot 
rolls, cake and milk.

WEDNESDAY—Ham and 
cheese sandwiches, fried okra, 
lettuce, tomatoes, light bread, fruit 
and milk.

The Friona High School girls 
junior varsity dropped a 35-33 
game to visiting Frenship here 
Tuesday in their season opening 
basketball game.

The game was close all the way, 
as quarterly scores were 6-6, 14-12 
and 25-25.

Nicole Potts led the Squaws with 
12 points, backed up by Ralna 
Roden’s nine.

SQUAW JV 6 8 11 8-33
Frenship 6 6 13 10-35

Holly Grimsley 1-0-2; Stephanie 
Downey 1-0-2; Stefanie Ancira 2- 
0-4; Nicole Potts 6-0-12; Lisa 
Weatherly 2-0-4; Ralna Roden 4-1- 
9; Kendra Gordon 0-0-0; Marcia 
Blackwell 0-0-0.

This DUDE’s the best chicken fried steak sandwich in the 
country! With a quarter-pound** of 100% pure beef, served up 

fresh and hot with your favorite fixin’s. You’ll be friends forever!
ON SALE NOVEMBER 14-27,1988

Now is the time of greatest fire hazard for 
your home. Make sure that your home and 
possessions are FULLY wotected .against loss. 
It costs nothing for professional help with your 
insurance program —  stop in and see us now!

G Reg. TM Tex. D.Q. Op. Court. ® Reg. TM Am. O.O. Corp. C  1988 Tex. D.Q. Op. Court 
•At participating Dairy Queen stores •’Pre-cooked weight

ETH R ID G E - SPRING 
I AGENCY,

6 0 3  Main St. F r io n a  
P h o n e  2 4 7 - 2 7 6 6

yourJ independent
Insurance / /agent
k seftves vou nw V NOTICE!

FRIONA STATE BANK

NOW HAS FOUR LANES OF DRIVE-UP 
BANKING TO SERVE YOU ...
AND ALL FOUR LANES ARE OPEN!

Storewide
U r r  (Nov. 15-19)

During our 1st ANNIVERSARY

group
group

NIKE BASKETBALL WILL BE 1  
GIVEN AWAY EVERY HOUR <ioam-5pm>1 

ON SATURDAY, NOV. 19th ]
Come in and Register!

$/J99
LL GROUP of SWEATS_________  O

W i t h  e v e ,  
o f  $ 7 5 .0 0

We will be staying open until 6 p.m
on Wednesday, Nov. 23rd to serve 
your banking needs.

° r  D io r i

oil obout
F r i o n a  St a t e  b a n k

417 M A I*  ClOVlS. MM 762*6664
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JOHN E. PRUITT

Resident’s 
Rites Are 
Held Tues.

Funeral services for John 
Edward Pruitt, 28, were held 
Tuesday afternoon at 2:30 at 
Bovina’s First Baptist Church, 
with Rev. Richard Grisham, 
pastor, officiating.

Burial was in Bovina Cemetery, 
under the direction of Ellis- 
Blackwell Funeral Home.

Pruitt was killed last Friday 
afternoon in a one-vehicle accident 
about 4 p.m. on the State Line 
Road north of Farwell.

DPS Trooper Rick Uribe said 
Pruitt lost control of the 1978 Ford 
pickup he was driving and hit a bar 
ditch virtually head on. The force 
of the crash ejected Pruitt from the 
vehicle and killed him.

Pruitt was born May 11, 1960 in 
Roseburg, Oregon. He had lived in 
Parmer County since 1964. He was 
employed as a farm laborer, and 
was a member of the First Baptist 
Church.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Misty Rose and Lindsey 
Rhea, both of Bovina; his parents, 
Primes and Carolyn Pruitt of 
Bovina; his grandparents, John L. 
and Susie Pruitt of Bovina and a 
brother, Steven Lee Pruitt of Fort 
Worth.

Pallbearers were Billy Smith, 
Larry Dopp, Jack Turner, Donald 
Dale, Stan Miller, Jerry Martin, 
Rick Radford and Kevin Smith.

Honorary pallbearers were R.B. 
Riley, Donnie Gustin, Nathan 
Cupit, Ronnie Ward, Gary 
Berggren and Jerry Ward.

Villarreal 
Rites Held 
Wednesday

Funeral services for Roberto 
Castaneda Villarreal, 24, were 
conducted Wednesday afternoon 
at the Sixth Street Church of 
Christ, with Victor Maldanado 
officiating.

Burial was in Friona Cemetery, 
under the direction of Ellis- 
Blackwell Funeral Home.

Villarreal was discovered dead in 
his pickup-truck Monday in 
Friona.

He was born in Mexico March 
20, 1964, and had lived in Parmer 
County the past 18 months. He 
was employed at the Excel Corp. in 
the hide room.

He married Sylvia Jiminez July 
1, 1986 in Mexico.

Survivors include his wife; his 
mother, Refugio Villarreal of 
Mexico; along with four sisters, 
Sandra Vasquez and Blanca 
Contreras, both of Mexico, Isabel 
Villarreal and Francisca Cisneros, 
both of Wisconsin; four brothers, 
Jose Villarreal of San Angelo, 
Raymond Villarreal and Ignacio 
Villarreal, Jr., both of Friona, and 
Ricardo Villarrreal of Del Rio.

Pallbearers were Salvador 
Garcia, Victor Alvarado, Juan 
Cuellar, Miquel Cuellar, Valente 
Casas and Jesus Lugo.

r a S  Classes 
Need Food

Friona High School classes are 
donating food to a Student 
Council drive to help needy 
families in the local area.

There will be a contest among 
the classes to see who can donate 
the most to encourage people’s 
support.

At the end of the drive, the food 
will be divided and put in boxes 
decorated by representatives of the 
classes.

The boxes will be given to the 
churches in the community for 
distribution. “ We hope this will 
help us reach some of the more 
needy families,” says a spokesman 
for the drive.

GROUP WORKS....The Circle of Friends is shown 
planting fall flowers in the City Park last week. Adults 
shown are Lori Holcomb, Patty Haile, Brenda Williams 
and Linda Thomas and their children.

Youngster’s 
Rites Set 
Monday

Funeral services for Robert 
Garcia Vargas, 14, will be held 
Monday at 3 p.m. at St. Teresa’s 
Catholic Church.

Rosary is scheduled for 8 p.m.
Sunday.

Burial will be in Friona 
Cemetery under the direction of 
Ellis-Blackwell Funeral Home.

Vargas, who suffered from 
muscular dystrophy, died 
Thursday, November 17 at St.
Anthony’s Hospice in Amarillo.

Vargas was born August 16,
1974 at Ulysses, Kansas. He was an 
eighth grade student at Friona 
Junior High School.

He was a member of St. Teresa’s 
Catholic Church, and was involved
in the Special Olympics for four and wih“ continue on 
years. He was a recipient of a trip from 9 a m t0 4
to Disneyland a few years ago Saturday’s events feature a style 
through the Make-A-Wtsh show at to :30 a.m. and a snack 
Foundation.

Survivors include his parents,
Raul and Adela Vargas of the 
home; one sister, Cristina Vargas; 
and two brothers, Raul P. Vargas 
and Humberto Vargas, both of the 
home; also his grandparents,
Emilio and Esther Olivas of 
Liberal, Kansas and Tomasa 
Vargas of Mexico.

G a s  L i g h t s  O n  S a l e  N o w !
It’s a special sale of West Texas’ favorite new yard lights!

• Heavy cast aluminum 
construction.

• Heat-tempered glass 
for durability.

• Makes a wonderful 
soft-glow light.

• Perfect for both front 
and back yards.

• Provides attractive 
security for your home.

• Quality installation 
available.

• Many beautiful styles 
and colors to choose 
from.

-Here’s something im portant-
It’s been a long time since 
we’ve been able to offer these 
beautiful gas yard lights like 
you used to see years ago. Now 
you can get them for your 
yard, and at a great price. But 
hurry! This special sale won’t 
last long.

starting from

$126.47
And with your good credit, you can put it all on your gas bill!

Contact any Energas employee, or 
call your nearest Energas office.

E N E R G Q S

ROBERT GARCIA VARGAS

Bazaar Is 
Underway

The Christmas in November 
bazaar is underway at the Friona 
Community Center.

The bazaar kicked off Friday,
Saturday

r
i Congratulations
i
i

i

1 
i

IONA RENNER

idea session at 1:30 p.m.

I t  9s A  B o y  
For M o h rs

Carl and Holly Mohr of Bryan 
became parents of a baby boy, 
William Douglas on November 3. 
The baby was born in St. Mary’s 
Hospital in Bryan.

The newborn weighed seven 
pounds, and measured twenty-one 
inches long. He has a sister, Holley 
Lynn, who is three years old.

Grandparents are Doug and Rita 
Stephenson of Friona, and Mrs. 
W.C. Mohr of Bryan.

Mrs. A.J. Hood of Winters is 
the baby’s great-grandmother.

WANTED!
(ALIVE)

C R A IN  SO R G H U M  REPRESENTATIVES

m m
FREE Gifts for Leads!
“ Thars go ld  in them there sorghum acres”

•  You m ay b e  a so rg h u m  p ro d u c e r  w an t ing  to b u y  your  
o w n  p ro d u c ts  at r e d u c e d  prices.,

•  O r  you m ay k n o w  of a fr iend w h o  e i th e r  farms o r  has 
a g o o d  retail ou t le t  w h o  w o u ld  m ake  us a g o o d  rep .  
(W e w o u ld  like to have either.)

•  Your f re e  gift is a 10' tape  m easu re  with a c h r o m e  case.

M ail Lead  to: HYBRID SEEDS
M ill H udson
t̂rrUory Manager

205 IOth Aw. 
Canyon TX 79015 

" SD61655-1652

N a m e

Address 

C i ty -----

Phone

State Zip
This lead furnished by:

Name

Address 

C i ty___

Phone

State

i
i
i
I

i
i

1
l

T  SALES
REPRESENTATIVE

FOR PIONEER. PRODUCTS
BRAND

Mrs. Renner Is Completing 20 Years of  
Dedicated Service With Our Company.

We Would Like To Salute Mrs. Renner on 
the Occasion o f this Milestone.

\
I
I
I
i
i
i
i

& ANIMAL HEALTH !I
A DIVISION OF FRIONA INDUSTRIES, INC.

AGRI-SPRAYERS
Jim Scott Coleman Young 
Store Mgr. Manager

_____ Bovina, Texas

CORN • SOYBEANS • ALFALFA 
SORGHUM • INOCULANTS • WHEAT

PIONEER
B R A N D  • P R O D U C T S

® Registered trademark of Pioneer Hi-Bred International, Inc., Des Moines, Iowa, U.S.A
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PH. 247-2211
Reader Ads-FIrst insertion, per w o rd ..................................20 cents
Additional insertions (no copy change, per w o rd )..............15 cents
Minimum C harge....................................................................... $2.50
Classified display (boxed ads-10 pt. type under a specific heading, 
1 column width only-no art or cuts. Per column in c h ............ $3.35

Card of Thanks-same as classified word rate, 20 cents per word, 
minimum charge..........................................................................$2.50

DEADLINE for classified advertising in Sunday’s issue- Thursday 
noon.

Check advertisement and report any error immediately. The Star is 
not responsible for error after ad has already run once.

All classified ads are CASH in ADVANCE. Only legal notices or 
continuous running ads will be billed. All other ads must be paid in 
full before they will be published.

ATTENTION-GOVERNMENT 
SEIZED VEHICLES from $100. 
Fords, Mercedes, Corvettes, 
Chevys. Surplus Buyers Guide, 1- 
602-838-8885, Ext. A-4506. 7-4tc

P  CARDS OF THANKS j

THANK YOU
The Friona Rebekah Lodge 308 

would like to thank each of you 
who attended our election day 
Turkey Dinner. It was our pleasure 
to serve you.

Lauretta Brookfield 
Secretary 

9-1 tc

FOR SALE i

L ANNOUNCEMENTS 1
J

Alcohol or drugs a problem? Call 
247-2754 AA and A1 Anon- 
Monday nights, 1601 Euclid.

29-tfnc

REPORT CHILD ABUSE 
CALL 1-800-252-5400

22-tfnc!

Order your Tupperware at the 
Christmas Bazaar on Saturday, 
November 19. It will be delivered 
to your door by UPS before 
Christmas. See Cindy (Barnett) 
Hawkins. 9-ltp

Friona Lodge No. 1332 
Stated Meeting-lst Tues. 8 p.m.

7th & Ashland 
J.W. Dixon, W.M. 
A.L. Outland, Sec.

Last day to have brands 
[included in Parmer County 
[brand book-

Tuesday, November 22, 1988 
[IT your brand is not registered in 

’armer County, call the Friona 
Chamber office, 247-3491.

9-2tc

BEWARE, unethical agent 
advising you drop your whole life 
insurance. DON’T. 40-tfnc

j " " " b u s in e s s  1J OPPORTUNITIES j

dealership
log homes

Your complete  Log H om e 
C o m p an y  has all o f  
A m er ica ’s finest lines, s ta r t ­
ing at 512,475. G reat  e a rn ­
ing potential,  will not in­
terfere with present em ploy­
m ent.  Investment 100% 
secured by model home. 
Call Don H ickm an ,  Toll 
Free 1-800-633-0670.

C O U N T R Y
L I V I N G  

L O G  H O M E S
P.O. Box 171080 
Nashville, TN 37217

r -
FOR SALE.... 1979 Dixie 18’ 
flatbed tandem trailer with front 
half enclosed, tool tray, $700.00. 
225 amp AC/DC Miller portable 
welder. Like new. $1,500.00 firm. 
Call 247-3003 or 265-3339 after 7 
p.m. 9-2tc

Bl-Wize Health Mart 
9 14 Karat Gold and Diamonds j 
j 60 Per Cent Off Every Day a 
f Call 247-3010 or I

Pharmacy, 247-2270 
902 Main 

Friona, Texas

1

♦ 
»

38-tfnc |

FOR SALE....1,200 rebar fence 
posts, 40c; 600 bags oyster shell 
flour, $2.50; thousands of feet 
conveyor belting, 12” -30” width, 
15* square foot. Don Fortenberry, 
295-6373. 7-tfnc

FOR SALE....Dark brown large 
drapes with deep cornice, 90” 
high, 144” wide. Call Syble 
Hewitt, 247-3632. 7-2tc

REAL ESTATE

F  a u t o m o t iv e ”  " I

FOR SALE.... 1977 Buick. Runs 
good, $975.00. Call Jackie 
Morgan, 247-2878 after 5 p.m.

9-tfnc

FOR SALE....Super nice 3-2-2, 
den with cathedral ceiling, central 
heat and a/c, large covered patio 
and storage building. Fenced back 
yard. 1617 W. 9th. Call 247-2486, 
265-3505 or 791-0006. 2-tfnc

OUR ANNUAL

FREE TURKEY
WITH THE PURCHASE OF A USED CAR OR TRUCK

OVER 35 TO CHOOSE FROM!

R E D U C T IO N S !

SALE ENDS NOVEMBER 23rd

FROM ALL OF US AT DOC STEWART'S

"HAPPY THANKSGIVING!"

D O C  S T E W A R T
GM QUALITY 

SERVICE PARTS
GIMIOAI MOIOtl COePODAltOW

= i  CHEVROLET - BUICK, INC.
2500 MABRY DR CLOVIS, NM 

-----1 (505) 763*4465

FOR RENT
SARATOGA GARDENS 

1300 N. Walnut Ave., Friona 
1, 2 or 3 BR apartments. Modern, 
all utilities paid. Kitchen equipped, 
carpeted, laundry facilities, cable 
TV, low rent for needy families. 

Phone 247-3666
33-tfnc

FOR RENT....Nice, clean 2 bed­
room apartment on West Ninth. 
Stove and refrigerator furnished. 
Call 806-364-7416. 9-2tc

SELL*LEASE*RENT-TO-OWN
8x6-8x16 Morgan storage 
buildings. Little as $25.00 per 
month delivered, 364-7713, 
Hereford. 37-tfnc

HOUSE FOR RENT....East of 
Hub, 265-3502. 7-tfnc

HELP WANTED \

HELP WANTED....Night
watchman needed. Apply in 
person. West Plains Feedyard.

3-tfnc
EARN $2000 or more monthly at
home! Details? Send SASE to 
Christine Associates, PO Box 213- 
B, Matawan, NJ 07747. 2-10tc

ATTENTION-HIRING! Govern- 
ment jobs-your area. $17,840- 
$69,485. Call 602-838-8885, Ext. J- 
4506. 7-4tc

$1,000 Weekly Earning Possibili­
ties! Earn Your Christmas Cash 
Now! Our firm needs people to 
work from HOME. Weekly 
Paychecks! To Apply-Send self- 
addressed, stamped envelope to 
Austin Enterprises, P.O. Box 
1806, Union, NJ 07083. 6-3tc

HELP WANTED.... Service 
Advisor/Service manager trainee. 
Good appearance and personality. 
Mechanical experience necessary. 
Call Jerry or Steve at Stevens 
Chevrolet-Oldsmobile in
Hereford, 364-2160. 9-2tc

2 BR, 1 bath, fenced back y a rd ....................................... $19,500.00

3 0
Colot 

f ’ Ik )lo',

1-10x13
(W«li Photo)

1- 8x10
2- 5x7 
2- 3x5

16-King Size Wallets 
8-Regular Size Wallets

99° Deposit 
1 0 00 Due et 

Pick up
(plus tax)

£

GIVE OUR PICTURE 
FOR CH R ISTM AS

AT

Eclectic Ideas
618 Main St.

Tues., Nov. 29 
10 a.m.-5 p.m.

WE USE 
KODAK PAPER

r
i  
i  
i  
i  
i  
i  
i  
i  
i  
i  
i

!  GARY G. SNEAD, GRI 
■ Res. 265-3383

3 BR, 2 baths, new siding, lots room, cellar...................$25,900.00
Horse barn, close to town, small acreage.........................$27,500.00
3 BR, 1 bath, single garage, refri. A/C, good buy........... $28,000.00
3 BR, VA baths, brick, must se ll.......................................$31,000.00
T PP_ 1 hoth_ ‘lYith 1 nnnrl” ""*" cat n  ctjaaaaa
3 BR, 13A baths, fence, seller will help with costs............. $36,000.00
3 BR, l 3/a baths, clean, double garage, storage shed___ $40,000.00
2 Duplexes, 4 units, excellent location, good income___$45,000.00
3 BR, l 3/4 baths, Country Home w/2 acres, brick, nice . $50,000.00

PROPERTY
102 East 11th St. 
247-2745

ANDY HURST 
Res. 247-3123

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I  
I 
I  
I  
I  
I  
I
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Group charge 
99c per person

We
U96

P A P E R
fo r  <) G o o d  l .o o k

WESLEY BARNETT REAL ESTATE 
i 108 W. 9th, Friona 247-39031
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BEST LOCATION, 3 bdi., S bmli....SOLD........................0 0  j
LOTS OF NEW THINGS in 3 bdr., 2 b a th ..........................$57,000 !
NEED TO SELL 3 bdr., 2 bath ............................................. $43,500 I
GREAT FIXER UPPER 3 bdr., 1 b a th ................................$25,000 j
BEAUTIFUL NEW CARPET, 3 bdr., 2 bath......................$79,500 |
LARGE GiARPORT; camper cp*cr , great price....SOLD.. $35,000 !
GREAT STARTER HOME, 3 bdr., 1 bath..........................$32,500 ;
GOOD LOCATION, good price, 3 bdr., 2 ba th ..................$40,000 !
LOTS OF ROOM, 3 bdr., 3 lo ts ........................................... $47,500 ■
LARGE BARN, 3 lo ts ........................................................... $20,000 :
FABULOUS DEN, 4 bdr., 3 bath. PRICE REDUCED.. . .  $84,500 ; 
YOUNG COUPLE-Great Opportunity, 3 bdr., 1 bath . . . .  $48,500 !

LAND
320 acres irrigated, southeast of Friona 

VACANT LOTS
Fantastic location for building-2 lots available.
One whole city block by tracks.

Wesley Barnett, Broker, 265-3646 
Kay Roach, Broker, 225-6024

< *
< *< >
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Realtors/Certified Appraisers
"If 9 I • • I ' l M f 1 ■ h . I r , * ; # » • 4 n § M

Farwell, Texas
481-3288

Drawer 887 109 5th St.

Need An Appraisal-Call Us.
We Need Your Listings Now.

J.B. Sudderth, Broker Daren Sudderth, Broker
Jimmie Mace, Sales Associate

230 acres Irrigated. Lays well. Immediate possession, in Rhea 
area.
960 acres, Including 130 acres native grass, five irrigation 
wells. Lays good. Rhea area.

HELP WANTED....Pen riders 
needed. Apply in person. West 
Plains Feedyard. 3-tfnc

£  LOST & FOUND j
$50.00 REWARD

Lost: Australian Shepherd cattle 
dog. Brown with white over 
shoulders. 2 blue eyes. Lost in the 
vicinity of West Plains Feedyard. 
Call 295-3154 nights. 7-2tc

SERVICES I

BE UNIQUE THIS YEAR!
Let us help you design your 
Christmas letters, and address 
them rather than send traditional 
cards. If cards are preferred, let us 
help you address them. Reasonable 
rates! Call Doris at Clerical 
Unique, 247-3230. 7-5tc

If yon need your vacant lots, 
alleys or yards shredded or 
plowed, call 265-3805.

39-dhb

Call your local used cow dealer for 
7 days a week dead stock removal. 
Serving the cattlemen for the past 
twenty years. Call 247-3032 or 1- 
800-692-4043. 51-26tc

Need grass seed cleaned? Do it on 
your farm. Call David Miller, 
(405) 938-2130. Call after 6 p.m.

3-4tp

H&VE-A 
BIG:TJME IN 

TE-XAS.• • m •

FOR CREA TIVE COLOR PORTRAITS

J LEGAL NOTICE
Accepting Bids: The City of Friona 
is accepting sealed bids to sell three 
pickup trucks: (1)1978 Ford, with 
utility bed, in running condition. 
(2) 1973 Ford in running
condition. (3) 1968 Ford in non- 
running condition. Bids will be 
accepted at City Hall, 623 Main 
Street, until 4:00 P.M., Friday, 
December 2, 1988. Vehicles may be 
seen by contacting City Hall. The 
City of Friona reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids.

LEGAL NO TICE^ j
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO 

ISSUE CITY OF FRIONA, 
TEXAS CERTIFICATES

OF OBLIGATION
Take notice that the City 

Council of the City of Friona, 
Texas, will convene at 7:30 p.m. 
on the 12th day of December, 
1988, at its regular meeting place in 
the City Hall of Friona, and, 
during such meeting, the City 
Council will consider the passage 
of an ordinance authorizing the 
issuance of certificates of 
obligation in an amount not to 
exceed $350,000 for the purpose of 
paying contractual obligations to 
be incurred for (i) improving and 
equipping the city’s health care 
facility and (ii) professional 
services rendered in connection 
therewith, such certificates to be 
payable from ad valorem taxes and 
a lien on and pledge of the net 
revenues derived from the •j . r i

ownership and operation of the; 
^city’s health care facility. The; 
certificates are to be issued, and • 
this notice is given, under and; 
persuant to the provisions o f ; 
V.T.C.A., Local Government; 
Code, Subchapter C of Chapter- 
271. 7-2tci

i)
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FFA QUIZ....The FFA Quiz team placed second in 
district and qualified for the area contests. From the left 
are Ryan Cash, Amy Rape and Tara Shelton.

. m

JUNIOR SKILLS....The Junior Farm Skills team placed 
first in district for the FFA. From the left are Charlie 
Snead, Corbin Riethmayer, Brandon Renner and Chad 
Hamilton.

Local FFA Teams 
Advance To Area
Friona High School’s FFA 

Leadership teams came home from 
the district leadership contests at 
Texas Tech with area qualifiers in 
seven of the eight events the local 
chapter entered.

Six of the events scored first 
place, another placed second and 
qualified for the area round, and 
another placed third.

The Senior Chapter Conducting 
team placed first. Team members 
are Chad Rhodes, Shannon

Thomas Is 
Recognized
By SPS

Dennis Thomas of Friona, who 
works for Southwestern Public 
Service Company (SPS) was 
recognized at the SPS Panhandle 
Division and Production Depart­
ment service awards dinner 
Thursday, November 3, in 
Amarillo for five years of service 
to customers.

He is among 374 employees of 
the company being recognized 
through a series of award dinners 
for a collective 5,410 years of 
service.

Cochran, Bob Dow, Dustee Gee, 
Ricky Rando, Travis Anderer and 
Edward O’Brian.

The Junior Conducting team 
likewise placed first. Members are 
Jennifer L. Smith, Jenifer K. 
Smith, Shawn Cole, Tamara Hand, 
Kassie Weatherley, Timothy 
Clark, Greg Salyer, Blue Field and 
Amy Rape.

The Farm Radio team placed 
first. Team members are Dempsey 
Jordan, Cody Burney, Daylen 
Gallman and Chad Beavers.

The Senior Farm Skills team was 
also first. Members are Guy Ellis, 
Jerry Lafuente, Jacky Lafuente 
and Julie Brown.

The Junior Farm Skills team 
placed first. Their members are 
Charlie Snead, Corbin Rieth­
mayer, Brandon Renner and Chad 
Hamilton.

The FFA Quiz team placed 
second. That team is made up of 
Ryan Cash, Amy Rape and Tara 
Shelton.

In addition, Gilbert Paiz placed 
first in creed speaking, and Nathan 
Brockman placed third in extem­
poraneous speaking.

The Area I leadership contests 
will be held November 19 at 
Clarendon College.

B A R G A I N B A R G A I N B A R G A I N

Dear Perrys Customer,
W e  g o t  l o s t  o n  o u r  w a y  

d o w n  S o u t h  s o  w e  w e r e  l a t e  f o r ]  

t h e  b i g  P e r r y s  F a l l  S a l e .

W e ' r e  h e r e  a t  t h e  s t o r e  

f i n a l l y  a n d  w e ' r e  s t i l l  a  g o o d  

b u y  s o  c o m e  c h e c k  u s  o u t .

C A N N O ^ h e e ^ e t s
Flat, Fitted, & Pillow Case

TWIN...........$ 8.99 set

FULL................$14.99 set

^  QUEEN........$18.99 set

1 KING.................$20.99 set

C A N N O N .  
Bath/ Scatter 
Rugs
20”x30" in a large 
variety of 
colors. $3.99

S i n c e r e l y ,

SENIOR TEAM....The Senior Chapter Conducting team 
for Friona FFA placed first at district. Members are, 
front, l-r: Chad Rhodes, Shannon Cochran, Darran 
Procter, Bob Dow and Dustee Gee. Standing are Ricky 
Rando, Travis Anderer and Edward O’Brian.

•fear*

i ■
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RADIO TEAM....Among the winning leadership teams 
for Friona FFA in the district contests was the Farm Radio 
team. Seated, l-r, are Dempsey Jordan, Cody Burney and 
Daylen Gallman. Standing is Chad Beavers.

amzg

JR. CONDUCTING....The Junior Chapter Conducting 
team for Friona FFA won first place at the district 
competition. Seated, l-r, are Jennifer L. Smith, Shawn 
Cole, Tamara Hand and Kassie Weatherley. Standing are 
David Reed, Timothy Clark, Greg Salyer, Blue Field and 
Amy Rape. Jenifer K. Smith also was a team member.

■mmmwsf
m m m f
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YOUNG WINNERS....Gilbert Paiz, left, placed first in 
creed speaking, and Nathan Brockman was third in 
extemporaneous speaking.

SHARE YOUR 
CREDIT UNION 
WITH FRIENDS

You know the benefits of being a credit union member.
You’ve probably taken advantage of our low-cost loans 

attractive dividends, plus protective insurance plans from tne 
companies within the CUNA Mutual Insurance Group.
But do your friends know? Have you told them about 

the advantages of credit union membership?
Why not spread the word? Tell your friends, neighbors, 

and co-workers. Share the rewards.

NCUA
s . t u

FRIONA TEXAS FEDERAL 
CREDIT UNION

6th & EUCLID PH. 247-2736

SKILLS TEAM....The Senior Skills team placed first in 
district. Members are (l-r) Guy Ellis, Jerry Lafuente, 
Jacky Lafuente and (standing) Julie Brown.

IV e i lm  W ean  
in  lexica

314 Wheeler - 482-3363
Regular Hours 8-6:30 cst

NEW. . .At Rip's-
$ 4 0 9 8ROPERS

As Low As

Men's 13MWZ

W ranglers Denfm $14 98

All Other 
Denim Colors

$H 0 9 8  Including NEW  Charcoal, *  
i I  w  NEW  Chesnut, Black,

Khaki and Grey.

Check our new selection of Holiday Items 
arriving dally. Christmas sweaters, Glnnle 
Johansen Scarves and Jewelry; Large 
selection of sterling - Buckles and Jewelry.

Red Wing Ladies'
WORK BOOTS BO O TS
AS LOW $ ^ 4 * 9 8 One Group $ Q Q 9 8

Values to M M  
$200 W W

f f l Rocky Mountain Ladies Silver Lake
JEANS W RA N G LERS

w \
/

COo>o
>

C
M $-| A 9 8

NEW! Rocky Tops 
To Match Values to 29.98

Ladies
B iO U S e S ............  Starting At $1 9 98

NOTICE: Starting November 25th - We will be open 
from 8:00 a.m.-9:00 p.m. C.S.T. for your shopping convenience.

LAYAWAYS WELCOME
WE ACCEPT

m

M a p p y , O deaC tfiy  

. . .'T o g e th e r  

is  o u r  f o n d e s t  

‘T h a n f^ s g iw n g  z o is h  f o r  

y o u !
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Junior High School
Rewards Students
Friona Junior High Principal 

Tom Johnson challenged the 
Junior High students to be at 
school every day possible during 
the month of October. Friona 
Junior High had 172 students at 
school every day during the month 
of October.

The percentages were figured by 
homeroom and the homeroom 
with the highest percentage of 
attendance was Mr. Herbert’s sixth 
grade homeroom with a 99.46%. 
Mr. Herbert’s homeroom will be 
rewarded with a trip to Tasty 
Cream one day in the near future.

The grade with the highest 
percentage was the eighth grade 
with a 97.49% attendance. They 
will be rewarded with a Coke party 
during homeroom in the near 
future.

All students (172) who were here 
every day had their names put on a 
piece of paper and a drawing was 
held at the pep rally last Thursday. 
Two names were randomly drawn 
and the lucky winners were Lana 
Allemand, seventh grader, and 
Steven Mann, eighth grade. These 
two students were rewarded with a 
Realistic Stereo Mate AM/FM 
Stereo Cassette Player with head 
phones.

The students really did a super 
job and we really appreciate it!

Here is a breakdown of all 
homeroom’s percentages and a list 
of all students who had 100% 
attendance.

Sixth grade-Herbert, 99.46%; 
Ratcliff, 97.37%; Randolph, 
96.84%; Gore, 96.66%; Brandon, 
96.05%; average, 97.27%.

Seventh grade-Slagle, 98.61%; 
Deckert, 98.24%; Dixon, 97.36%; 
Pryor, 96.07%; Warren, 94.37%; 
average, 96.93%.

Eighth grade--Perkins, 99%; 
Whiteley, 98.70%; Talley,
96.88%; Griffin, 96.84%;
Hancock, 96.05%; average,
97.49%.

Students having perfect
attendance during the month were: 
Sixth grade-Doraly Alfaro,
Rebecca Almager, Jeff Appling, 
Jamie Arias, Lupita Baeza, Crystal 
Bautista, Brent Beene, Cory 
Bentley, Alice Black, Sheldon 
Burleson, Sarah Camacho, Shaun 
Carrasco, Maria Castanon, Shane 
Childers, Brian Clark, Connie 
Clark.

Also, Hank Duke, Andrea 
Escobedo, Christi Garcia, Lance 
Goen, Adelita Gonzalez, Nick 
Gonzales, Kevin Gregory, Cory 
Hamilton, Davy Hamilton,
Melissa Hardin, Roy Hendley, 
Chad Henry, Junior Hernandez, 
Wade Hinkle, Andria Johnson,
Lindsey Johnson, Lori Jordan.

Also, Jerard Lafuente, Jodi

Looper, Susana Lopez, Jaime 
Mata, Dinora Mejia, Esmeralda 
Mendez, Michelle Mendoza, 
Wendy Orozco, Bobby Ortiz, 
Charlie Pope, Kit Preston, Jerry 
Prieto, Charlotte Procter, Freddy 
Ramirez, Amy Raymond, Jason 
Rector.

Also, Kathy Rios, Juan Rivera, 
Antonio Rocha, Mark Rodriquez, 
Berenice Salinas, Monty Schueler, 
Cristy Smith, Jessica Smith, Luis 
Vasquez, Iris Vega, Jose Vega, 
Bridget Villa, Mauricio Vital, Billy 
Wallace, Jason Wells and Tawn 
White.

Seventh grade-Josh Abeyta, 
Lana Allemand, Monica Ancira, 
Andriana Casas, Imelda 
Castaneda, Audra Clark, Monica 
Cruz, Renee Downey, Misty 
Drake, Lee Ann Ford, Jose 
Gallegos, Rocio Garcia, Jon 
Goddard, David Gonzales, Kris 
Gordon, Shannon Gregory, Poppy 
Grimsley.

Also, Esmeralda Guerra, Eddie 
Gutierrez, Trista Hand, April 
Hardin, Jeremy Hart, Michelle 
Highsmith, Derrick Jones, Errick 
Jones, Salvador Juarez, Charlie 
Leal, Jason Medrano, Christina 
Mora, Beth Noey, Maria Ortiz, 
Jamie Padilla, Albert Parson, 
Justin Peek.

Also, Darla Procter, Chesley 
Ray, Bilma Rocha, Celsa 
Rodriquez, Don Salcido, Marite 
Salinas, Carlos Silva, Heather 
Smith, Roger Sparkman, Joe 
Tagle, John Tannahill, Teresa 
Taylor, Miguel Torres, Michael 
Villa, Jennifer White, Vacresia 
White and Andy Wilkerson.

Eighth grade-Jessica Alvarado, 
Senera Alvarado, Jim Ancira, 
Belinda Bautista, Jeanie Bautista, 
Julie Bracken, Angela Cappa, 
Ismael Castaneda, Eloy Castanon, 
Roxanna Castillo, Linda Chairez, 
Liz Constancio, Sergio Correa, 
Socorro Cruz, Sally Cruz, 
Abraham DeLaO, Deanna Ellis, 
Lance Frazier, Robert Garcia.

Also, Trisha Gibson, Gabriel 
Gonzales, Boone Hand, Dawn 
Henry, Kristin Holland, Susan 
Huckabee, Christy Ichtertz, Kelly 
Jack, Sylvia Juarez, Freda 
Lafuente, Jennifer Lamb, Sarah 
Maldonado, Steven Mann, Renee 
Martin, Benito Mejia, Mark 
Outland, Peggy Padilla, Jon 
Parker, Dora Parson.

Also, B.J. Parvin, Carmen 
Perez, Cindy Perez, Laura Prieto, 
Adam Raymond, Jolyn 
Raymond, Enrique Rodriguez, 
John Schlenker, Jimmy 
Sparkman, Amy Stephens, Chad 
Stovell, Mary Vasquez, Angie 
Vega, Gene Waldrop, Jennifer 
White, Carrie Wilkerson, Eddie 
Wilson and Jason Wright.

Grid Contest...
(Continued from Page 1)

picked 13 games, just missing a 
chance at a weekly prize. They 
were Jerry Bentley, Raul Braillif, 
Jack Clark, Alex Guerra, Myrtle 
Melton, Jessie Morales, Charlie 
Morgan, Dianne Morgan, Joy 
Morton, Vicky Moss, Brenda 
Patterson, John Seright and Don 
Max Vars.

Picking 12 games correct were 
Jo Blackwell, Richard Dickson, 
Martha Espinoza, Kirk Frye, 
Eddie Gauna, Danny Guerra, 
Scott Houston, Alan Monroe, 
Donnie McDonald, Kent 
Patterson, Larry Rogers, Chuck 
Senter, Rodney Shelby, Mitchell

Smiley, Jimmy Walker, J.O. 
Warren and Max White.

In gaining his win, Zachary 
missed only five of the contest 
games: Bovina-Silverton, Baylor- 
Rice, Houston-Seattle, San Fran- 
cisco-Denver and Cleveland-New 
Orleans.

The contest has been sponsored 
along with the Friona Star by a 
number of merchants in the area. 
The final week’s contest may be 
found on page 10 of this issue. 
With the Thanksgiving holiday 
coming up, contestants are 
reminded to get their entries in 
before leaving town for the 
weekend.

AN AVERAGE TELLER....Sondra Nichols was an 
alligator on Halloween at Friona State Bank. She is shown 
waiting on Beverly Bentley of Allsup’s. In the background 
is Katherine Blackburn, who was Aunt Jemima.

I
L

MEDICARE SUPPLEMENT POLICY 
$31.50 Per Month

Pays 100% of your hospital deductible. Pays 100% of Part B 
medicare co-insurance with no deductible. Pays at Dr's, of­
fice, clinic, home, in-patient and out-patient. This policy is 
designed to m eet the new catastrophic coverage in 1990. 
There is a prescription drug writer available with this policy.

Ages: G5-69 
70-74 
75-79 
80-84 
85 +

$31.50 per month 
$36.25 per month 
$40.92 per month 
$44.09 per month 
$52.09 per month

Tor more Information, please return the Information request form listed below.

MEDICARE SUPPLEMENT INSURANCE
P.O. Box 50900 

Amarillo, Texas 79159-0900
f -------------

j Name _

| Address
I

Age

Phone

City State Zip J

)

THE._____.
ocpontedl 
SUNMARK

*(Z 'Urw^uJt CBovfat** *
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reundaII
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V
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Agricultural Markets, Weather and 
Commentary at Your Finger Tips...

Grain & Livestock Quotes 
10-Minute Delayed 
Complete options and futures 
quotes from the m ajor com­
modity exchanges are provided 
for your review 24-hours a day. 
A nd while the m arkets are 
t r a d in g .. .y o u ’re only a few 
minutes behind the action on the 
floor!

You get: Chicago/Board and 
Mercantile, Kansas City Board of 
trade, M inneapolis and New 
York, Exchanges.

You 11 be up with the best and 
ahead of the rest!

W eather Reports...Local,
Regional, U.S. & Foreign 
W eather is an im portant part of 
your day  as well as you r 
m a rk e tin g  p la n s  and  D a ta  
Transmission Network provides 
weather for both. Using some of 
the most accurate sources, we 
give you reliable short and long 
range reports on local, regional, 
n a t io n a l  a: d in te r n a t io n a l  
weather. And, we report on crop 
conditions and progress.

Complete, Ready to Help 
You Get on Top of M arkets
Your monthly fee plus a one­
time start-up fee is all you 11 need 
to spend. DTN comes com­
p le te ...e v e ry th in g  is in c lu d ­
ed ...rece iver, video m onito r, 
antenna and even the cable to 
hook it up. Or, if you wish D ata 
Transmission Network can be 
received on a satellite dish. F====&

Complete Professional 
M arket Analysis
Not only do you get the infor­
mation you need...when you need 
it, bu t you get in-depth analysis 
of what happens and why. Pro­
fessional DTN analysts are con­
stantly  in-tune with the markets 
and in-touch with key players and 
observers. Throughout the day 
they 11 give you the kind of 
m arket insight tha t you can only 
get from experts! All this and 
more for only $19.95 per month in 
Kansas, Missouri & Nebraska. 
$24.95 per month in Colorado, 
Oklahoma and Texas.

Local Cash Prices for 
Grain and Livestock 
Another added value of your 
D ata  T ransm ission  N etw ork 
subscription is the availability of 
cash prices being paid locally for 
grain and livestock. Each day 
local elevators, livestock term i­
nals and auction barns are con­
tracted to get complete cash 
prices. Data Transmission Net­
work will save you time and 
phone calls. Giving you daily 
price information from a wider 
regional area, so you can get the 
best prices.

IJV*

DTN-75 pages of continuously updated in­
formation th a t you access individually, when 
you want.

Easy-to-Use...no codes, 
no phone, no keys, 
no computer
And best of all D ata Transmis 
sion Network is easy to use. As 
easy as turning on a light and you 
g e t  th e  i n f o r m a t i o n  y o u  
need...instantly. All 75 video text 
pages are always up-to-date, 
ready to use.

No Risk 30-day 
Guarantee...
To get you started, we offer this 
simple guarantee: If for any 
reason, you’re not completely 
satisfied with your DTN service, 
simply call us within 30 days to 
cancel your service and we'll re­
fund 100% of your money...no 
questions asked.

AN ELECTRONIC AGRICULTURAL MARKET INFORMATION SERVICE
Data Transmission Network Corporation

Turner Electronic Systems
H CR1, Box 44 Ph. 225-4922 or 225-4923

SATELLITE TV SYSTEMS: 
Receivers 
Dish Antennas 
Video De-scramblers

DTN AGRICULTURAL INFO:
Commodity Market Information 

Over Satellite Sc FM Radio.
Low Priced at $24.95 per month

Bovina, Texas, 79009
TELEPHONE FACSIMILE EQUIPMENT:

Fax Phone Copier 
Transmit Sc Receive Documents 
Fast & Inexpensive on Phone 

UHF-VHF ANTENNA SYSTEMS:
Improved TV Performance. Go UHF for 

ABC, CBS, NBC & PBS network program­
ming. Small antenna design, durable, less 
expensive.

«
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TRIONA WHEAT 
GROWERS

RON SMILEY, MGR.

2 4 7 - 3 2 1 1

Canyon-Brownfield winner vs 
Decatur-Colorado City winner

3 .  Hereford-Sweetwater winner vs 
yw».Everm an-Cleburne winner

1 m

i .

-. - • *. •» • * -. 4 > • > - >
-1 4. 
4 >
-> < * <» < > <> «> 4. •» 4. • ► < > < * -> 4 > 4> 
4 . -. <» < > <> <►

LAKESIDE
PARTS &

MACHINE
W. HWY. 60 
PH. 247-3939

FLORIDA AT FLORIDA ST.

KENDRICK  
OIL CO.

Ph. 247-2751 824 Main St

Littlefield-Denver City winner 
2 .  vs Springtown-Clyde winner

1 > 4 i 4 . 1 . 4 • 4 > 4 > 4 ► 4 ► 4 * 4 » 4 * 4 > 4 > 4 . 4 . 4 * 4 > 4 . 4 » 4 > * > 4 > 4 ► 4 » 4 » 4 > 4 > 4 ► 4 I 4 » 4 » 4 > 4 ► < * 4 .

TASTY CREAM 
DRIVE-IN

SANDWICHES ★  DRINKS 
★  SHORTORDERS
BILL&RUTHIE HARDIN 

PH.247-3060

1 0 .  ARIZONA ST. AT ARIZONA ji 1 2 .  ARKANSAS VS MIAMI

RICKEY RECTOR 
SEED COMPANY

FRIONA, TEXAS
Phone 265-3439

Two Excellent Seed Companies with 

Top Quality Corn & Milo Hybrids.

1 1 .  NOTRE DAME AT SO. CAL.

WEATHERLEY’S
FEED & SUPPLY

R a n d y  W e a th e r l e y

W. Hwy 60  Ph. 2 4 7 -2 3 7 4
★  Animal Health Supplies ★ Tack 

★  Purina & Top Flite Feeds ★ P e t  Products

HUB GRAIN
COMPANY
Phone 265-3215

NEW ENGLAND AT 
INDIANAPOLIS

WEST PLAINS 
FEEDYARD 

INC.
7

Ph. 295-3100

1 4 .  CLEVELAND AT WASHINGTON

yucuffr

1011 Grand 
Friona, TX 79035 
(806) 247-2701

Quanah-Idalou winner vs 
4 .  Reagan Co.-DeLeon winner

PRODUCTION

CV i ^ i c t i o n
reditVSSociation

CREDIT
ASSN.

WADE WRIGHT, VICE-PRESIDENT
_  Lazbuddie-Wilson winner vs 
5 -  Sierra Blanca-Christoval winner

FRIONA ★  STAR
Y our  Voice In T he  Com m unity  

F o r  6 4  Years!

P h o n e  2 4 7 -2 2 1 1

44444444 > 4 -

4444444'44444444444

C O R P O R A T I O N  

P. O. BOX  457 • W. HWY 60

FRIONA, TEXAS 79035

MIAMI AT N.Y. JETS

I
i
i

CONTEST RULES
1. Pick the winner of the 20 games listed in the 
advertisements on this page. Write the winners in the blanks 
provided on the official contest blank.
2. Pick the score of the tie-breaker game. This score will be 
used to break weekly as well as grand prize winners.
3. Bring your entry blank by the Friona Star or Bi-Wize Drug 
by 6 p.m. on Friday. Entries mailed must be postmarked by 
Friday and most be received in the Star office by the 
following Monday.
4. The leading contestant at the close of the contest will 
receive $100 cash as grand prize.
5. Only one entry per person.
6. To count for the grand prize, entries must be on official 
blank printed in the paper.
7. Contestants must be 12 years of age or older.
8. Everyone eligible to enter (sponsors included) except 
employees of the Friona Star and their families.

CASH PRIZES

4 ► 4 l 4 > 4444444444444444

FRIONA 
TRANSPORT,
INC. Harold Warren, Mgr. 

Phone 247 2724

1ST 2ND 3RD

FEED AND GRAIN HAULING

I
: 1 6 .  BUFFALO AT CINCINNATI

Electricity is peaceful
D O N ’T

MAKE IT PAINFUL!
Carelessness is the root cause of nearly ail 
accidents involving electricity. Stacking 
irrigation pipe underneath a high line may 
net be dangerous.
But upending a siring of pipe later, to dis­
lodge a varmint could bring disastrous 
results.
Follow the safely guidelines when deal­
ing with power lines. Never place any­
thing within reach of the overhead wires.

DEAF SMITH

I
l

l

\
i
I
I
l

l
ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE, INC.

1 7 .  L.A. RAMS AT DENVER
I

GRAND
PRIZE

6 .
Palo Duro-Eastwood winner vs 
Lewisville Marcus-Lamar winner

4 * 4 >
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4 ►
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4 >41< i< ►
4 >
4 >
4 *
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VASEK SERVICE & 
EQUIPMENT, INC.

102 16th St.
Hereford 364-3867

LENNOX

7. TULANE AT LSU

BI-WIZE

MIKE & CLAUDIA HANES 
PH. 247-3010 

PHARMACY PH. 247-2270

IS GEORGIA TECH AT GEORGIA
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247-3914 247-3913

1 8 .  N.Y. GIANTS AT NEW ORLEANS
4444444444444444444444
4444444444444444444 ►

FRIONA FARMERS 
CO-OP GIN

Jerry Butman, Mgr.

LOCATION: Hwy. 214 

1 1/2 miles So. Friona

PHONE: 265-3398

I! 1 9 .  PHILADELPHIA AT PHOENIX

S E R V I C E  

C E N T E R
★  Air Conditioning ★  Brake Center 
★  Transmissions ★  Rear End Work

Mike a n d  C la rence  Mart in
W. Hwy. 60 Ph. 247 -2731

2 0 .  L.A. RAIDERS AT SEATTLE

f 

I 
I 
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I 
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Was EOSC
?t Speaker

The first Bible Chair director, 
Leon Talley, shared the beginning 
days of the Church of Christ Bible 
Chair program at Eastern
Oklahoma State College, 
Wilburton, with Bible Chair
members and guests during a 
Saturday evening homecoming 
banquet held at the center October

“ All students are welcome,” 
Bettes said. “ There is no 
restriction or discrimination 
relative to denomination or church 
preference, only the expectation 
that each member will conduct 
themself in good moral conduct 
and enjoy the Christian fellowship 
with one another.”

The Church of Christ Bible 
Chair is under the direction of a 
committee consisting of Leland 
Walker, Dale Bettes, Jr., Randy 
Harp and Bettes.

“ The banquet brought back 
many good memories when 
returning students and directors 
were reunited, many for the first 
time since departing Eastern,” 
Bettes said.

Talley served as director of the 
campus Church of Christ Bible 
Chair from 1970-75, and is now 
minister for the Friona Church of 
Christ.

Bible Chair activities are 
supported by Churches of Christ 
across the southeast one-third of 
Oklahoma.

When the Bible Chair program 
at Eastern Oklahoma State College 
was formed, the program was 
administered under the eldership 
of the Wilburton Church of 
Christ.

Elders of the Wilburton 
congregation in 1970 included Dan 
Humphrey, Dr. James Miller, 
Buddy Wallace and current Bible 
Chair director, Dale Bettes.

Bettes said the mission of the 
Bible Chair is to provide active 
participation in campus activities, 
teaching Bible classes both on 
campus and off for Christian 
growth and to provide a student 
center for Christian fellowship 
activities.

Vicki Knight 
Re-Enlists

Sgt. 1st Class Vicki D. Knight, 
daughter of James E. and Minnie 
A. Knight of Friona, has re­
enlisted in the U.S. Army at 
Schofield Barracks, Hawaii, for 
six years.

Knight is a tactical transport 
helicopter repairer with the 25th 
Aviation Regiment.

In 1970, she graduated from 
Friona High School, and received 
an associate degree in 1972 from 
Amarillo Junior College.

PRESENTS PLAQUE....Bible Chair director Dale 
Bettes, right, presented retired Eastern Oklahoma State 
College president, Dr. James Miller, with a plaque of 
appreciation for his ‘ 'dedicated service in fund raising and 
as treasurer of the Church of Christ Bible Chair since 
1970,” during the Bible Chair homecoming evening 
banquet Saturday, October 29.

BANQUET SPEAKER....Leon Talley was the speaker at 
the Eastern Oklahoma State College homecoming 
banquet. He was the first director of the Bible Chair when 
the campus related organization began in 1970. Talley, 
who served for five years as director of the center, is now 
minister for the Friona Church of Christ.

ETHRIDGE-SPRING  
INSURANCE AGENCY , INC

6 0 3  Main St. 
F r io n a ,  TX.
Ph .  2 4 7 - 2 7 6 6

An investm ent in Your Future
YOUR

IftUjronCfM A G EN T

FIRST MEXICAN BAPTIST CHURCH 
904 Washington-Rnben Rivera :

P. O. Box 789 

Friona, Texas 79035
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Sixth & Suramitt

GIB’S DRIVE-IN
CLEANERS

Ph. 247-3150
622 Main St. Friona , Texas

CALVARY BAPTIST 
14th & Cleveland-Vergil T. Ichtertz

TEMPLO BAUTISTA 
4th & Woodland-Rev. Hebert Palomino

ST. ESTHER’S BAPTIST CHURCH 
5th & Main-Rev. I.S. Ansley, Pastor

FRIONA UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
8th & Pierce-Rev. Tommy Ewing

Ph. 247-3710 or 247-8077
REDEEMER LUTHERAN CHURCH 

13th & Virginia-Rev. Don L. Kirlden1104 W. Hwy. 60 Friona , Tx

TEMPLO “MARANATHA” 
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
301 Grand-Jesns Balderas, Pastor

UNION CONGREGATIONAL CHURCH
Euclid At 16th-

SIXTH ST. IGLESIA de CRISTO 
502 West Sixth Street

SIXTH ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST 
502 West Sixth-T. Leon Talley

y  he old proverb “still water runs deep” meant that people who 
talked very little, like Calvin Coolidge, were supposed to be thinking 
profound thoughts about important things. There is probably more truth 
here if the proverb is reversed “deep water runs still,” for most great 
people are not noisy about their greatness. Nowhere is this principle truer 
than when applied to God. He does not force Himself upon us; He will not 
dazzle our eyes and force us to respect; He has left man free even to reject 
his Creator. The Bible says that this is exactly what man, every person, 
has done. We have all repeated the tragedy of Adam and the meaning 
has drained out of life.

Our rejection, however, does not end God’s love. He continues to 
send His rain on the just and unjust But far more than this He sends 
an only son that through Him we may become reconciled to God, for here 
we can see the magnificent depth of God’s steadfast love. His love con­
tinues to flow deep and still like this stream, ever there for whoever will 
turn to Him in trust.

TENTH ST. CHURCH OF CHRIST
10th & EucUd

Mike Lamb 
AUTOMOTIVE, INC

“Auto Recycler”

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
10th 8 t Ashland-Leland Hart, Pastor

l T " h,ne * with
,em s o°n?‘7 hu' 
* ‘ kcr- He a/one m i"d Assure.
£% &  st *■

C ' on

r '» everyone!

ST. TERESA’S CATHOLIC CHURCH 
16th & Cleveland-Father Timothy Dran, S.A

your life ’faction > 
5n prob- God 0ur

Can forgive

Urfh God has I 
y1 and proc- I 

S''cncss and I 
Ju< a church I  

,' fated I
C l l be  I  C'>iirch thould I

Friona

UNITED PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
5th & Ashland Rev. Marty MartinezBrown, Graham & Co.,

P.C.
Certified Public Accountants 

901 Main Friona Ph. 247-2743

IGLESIA COMPANERISMO CRISTIANO 
7th & Washington-Ruben Rivera, Pastor

FRIONA STATE BANK
“Where People Come First9

MEMBER, FDIC 

1105 Cleveland Ph.247-21

CLEO’S  CLEANERSPAT WALKER FIGURE SALON
“ R e s u l t s  S t a r t  W h e n  Y o u  D o ”

Open  9 - 6  Mon.-Fr i .
Salons in Friona, Dimmitt, Hereford

7 1 5 Main F r i« n «  P h . 2 4 7 - 3 9 4 8

Affiliated Food Member Store 
1205 Hwy. 60 W. 

Friona, Texas p h . 247-3913

Professional Dry Cleaning 
* Drapes & Alterations

Friona Ph. 2 4 7 -3 1 7 0

LUCKTS 
TIRE SERVICE

ROAD AND FIELD SERVICE

HELEN ROMO 
BOOKKEEPING 

AND TAX SERVICE

PACO
FEED YARD

P h o n e  2 4 7 - 3 5 0 0  o r  2 4 7 - 2 3 5 2

9 1 3  W ash ing ton

P h .  2 6 5 - 3 4 3 3  
F r io n a  , Texas

F r io n a ,  Texas Friona, Texas
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ATTENTION 
LIVESTOCK PRODUCERS- - -

SPECIAL SALE PRICES GOOD THRU NOVEMBER 26TH
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HIPRO

For a limited time, I’ll save 
you 50< a bag on every bag of beef 
cattle starter ration or finisher ration you buy.

CALF STARTER 287
Per 50 Lb. Bag

CALF FINISHER 290
Per 50 Lb. Bag

Reg*«t»ced trademark of Pioneer Hi-Bred International. Inc

FEEDS

The 50< discount is a limited-time offer. 
See m e today!

HIPRO HIPRO

$ 4 3 9
FEEDS

SHOW PIG RATION 14(5

Per 50 Lb. Bag

Q  *-PR0 ieee

Save 50« per bag during this limited-time 
offer and get the winner’s favorite show ration.

See me today!

LAMB RATION
Per 50 Lb. Bag

<9 Registered trademark of Poneer Hi-Bred International, Inc

FEEDS

1440

c If

★  ANIMAL HEALTH SUPPLIES ★
PRO PEN G 250cc

Rubbermade

STOCK TANK too Ga

S i * ' "  j <1

w  t k

SEE OUR NEW 3,000 
SQUARE FOOT STORAGE 
FACILITY AND DOCK.

Rubbermade

STOCK TANK so Gal.

ERYTHROMYCIN
250cc

TRAP-N-A-SAK

A '  We’RE ANXIOUS TO WORK WITH

THE 4-H AND FFA KIDS KIDS IN 

THEIR FEEDING PROGRAMS.

★  CUSTOMERS COME 
FIRST AT HI-PR0.

T R  A P - IX I-A -S A K
The sweet com trap rodents can’t resist: 

KILLS RATS AND MICE

GET YOUR FEED AND 
ANIMAL HEALTH 
SUPPLIES ALL AT ONE 
LOCATION.

RICK CARR
Animal Health Supplies & Equipment 

A N IM A L  HEALTH
A DIVISION OF FRIONA INDUSTRIES. INC

“ RED” KINGSTON
Animal Health Supplies & Equipment 

A N IM A L  HEALTH
A DIVISION OF FRIONA INDUSTRIES. INC

Box 519 • E Highway 60 • Friona, Texas 79035

Office Phone I806I 247-2791 Res. Phone 1806) 247-2002

Box 519 • E. Highway 60 • Friona, Texas 79035

Office Phone <8061 247-2791 Res. Phone (806) 247-3819

0
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Town Talk
By June Floyd

Call 247-3681 With Your News Item
Monday of last week was a real 

special day for the Town Talk 
editor. Friona High School has 
three Foreign Exchange Students 
this year and I had the privilege of 
meeting and interviewing each one 
of them.

Lau Jensen is a native of 
Denmark, and is living in the home 
of Mr and Mrs. Jackie Stowers.

Sonia Castillo, who hails from 
Mexico City, is living in the home

JOE MURPHREE

Murphree
Completes
Training

Joe Murphree, C-Store 
Supervisor, Kendrick Oil 
Company, recently completed the 
Phillips 66 C-Store Training 
Program in Bartlesville, 
Oklahoma.

The program, taught by top 
petroleum and convenience store 
industry professionals, included 
modem methods of convenience 
store management, automated 
management systems, product 
merchandising, and personnel 
management.

of Mr. and Mrs. Jack Hamil.
Dorte Riess, a native of 

Nuernberg, Germany, is making 
her home with Mr. and Mrs. 
George Frye.

These three Fine young people 
were very cooperative and patient 
with my lack of knowledge of their 
languages and made brave efforts 
to compensate for it.

Our readers will have the

Contest
Standings
158-Eddie Mann.
157-Jerry Bentley and Charlie 

Morgan.
156—Jack Clark and Dianne 

Morgan.
155—Mitchell Smiley.
153-Mark Neill.
152—Tom Johnson and J.O. 

Warren.
151-Alex Guerra and Vicky 

Moss.
150-Jackie Morgan, Joy 

Morton and Donnie McDonald.
149—Bill Carter, Martha

Clements, Richard Dickson and 
Jerry Hinkle.

148-Wayne Amstutz, Rick 
Carr, Alan Monroe and Don Max 
Vars.

147-R.L. Blakely and Brenda 
Patterson.

146—Rhonda Bentley and 
Donita Martin.

145-Raul Braillif, Danny
Guerra, Mai Manchee, Jessie 
Morales, Chuck Senter, Jimmy 
Walker and Mark Zachary.

144-Dee King, Elizabeth Peak 
and Joe Tongate.

141-Jo Blackwell and Charles 
Hamilton.

140—Kirk Frye, Clint Mears and 
John Seright.

139-Lairy Rogers.
138-Tim Elmore and Mike 

Meyer.
137-Tommy Moss and Bobby 

Wied.

opportunity to learn more about 
these young people when the 
Christmas edition comes out next 
month.

* * * *

Since that Monday, I have spent 
some time visiting in the home of a 
brother-in-law and sister, Pete and 
Mary Bell Clements, who live in 
Dalhart, Texas, and in the home of 
Gerald, Jana and Sarah Floyd, 
whose home is in Elkhart, Kansas, 
and plan to be at the Phillips Bar 
Diamond Ranch in Central 
Montana by the end of this week.

Then for the next several weeks, 
I plan to be visiting in the home of 
Wes, Susan, Clint, Kory and Tye 
Phillips, who live about ten miles 
or so north of Lewistown.* * * *

SLEIGH BELLS RING. . 
AND HOOVER CLEANS

Fannie Meeks of Little Rock, 
Arkansas is visiting in the homes 
of her kith and kin in Friona. She’s 
the sister of Willard Stewart and 
the sister-in-law of Eufaula 
Ethridge.

* * * *
Several persons saw a 1984 

graduate of Friona High School on 
the front page of Tuesday’s 
Avalanche Journal. Shayne 
Woodard was pictured accepting a 
$5000 check from Steve Morrow, 
Saddle Tramps president.

The caption reported that the 
money would be used to establish 
the first scholarship in the Student 
Association, of which Woodard is 
president, endowment fund.

He is the son of Clyde Woodard 
of the Hub community and Janet 
Payne of Albuquerque.

His grandparents are Mr. and
Mrs. R.E. Snead, Friona, and
Mrs. Ethie Woodard, Fort Worth.

* * * *

For about ten days both of Mrs. 
Pearl Talley’s sons, Clarence and 
C.H. Veazey, were patients in 
Amarillo hospitals. Clarence 
returned home Tuesday after a ten 
day stay in Amarillo Veteran’s 
Hospital, where he was a medical 
patient.

Then, on Thursday, C.H. was 
released from High Plains Baptist 
Hospital, where he had spent 
about two weeks as a medical and

surgical patient.
Pam Veazey, the oldest daughter 

of C.H. and Joyce, returned to her 
home in the Philippines, where she 
is a classroom teacher, Tuesday 
afternoon.

* * * *
Edith Johnson returned home 

Monday of last week after 
spending several fun Filled days 
with cousins, Mr. and Mrs. D.C. 
Collier of Kingston, Oklahoma, 
which is on Lake Texoma.

These three visited an assort­
ment of cousins in Oklahoma and 
Texas.

Edith reported visiting a former 
teacher, Arvie Lewis Verble, who 
taught here from 1930-37. She 
said, “ Miss Lewis taught 
penmanship and her writing was 
beautiful then and still is.”

Now, I know where Edith
learned how to write beautifully.

* * * *
Seva Struve is home again after 

an absence of two weeks. She has 
been down to Houston to visit a 
cousin and his wife, Louie and Iola 
Fay Welch. Seva and her three 
sisters, Estella Johnston of 
Cypress, California, Melba Brown 
of Tulsa, Oklahoma and Muma 
Miller of Dimmitt, met at the 
Welch Galveston Bay home.

Louie, a former mayor of 
Houston, and his wife participated 
in the annual “ Noche de Las 
Americas” at the ballroom of the 
Westin Galleria Hotel. For the 
banquet, which was the highlight 
of the evening, Estella, Seva, 
Melba and Muma were special 
guests as were Gil and Sherri 
Welch and Gary Welch, all of 
Houston.

Madrid, which is Houston’s 
sister city in Spain, sends a flag 
each year and the presentation of 
the flag is a very colorful 
ceremony.

Enroute home, Seva spent 
several days visiting in the home of 
Melba and her husband, Joe, who 
live in Tulsa.

* * * *
If you’re bothered by the 

weather, you should not be a 
farmer.

ELMER & MA VA NORTHCUTT o f Friona will be 
honored at a reception on the occasion o f their 50th 
wedding anniversary. The reception will be held on 
Saturday, November 26 from 2-5 p.m. at the Broadview 
Church o f Christ, Broadview, New Mexico. The 
Northcutts are lifelong ranchers and farmers in the area. 
Their children, Jerry Northcutt and Wanda Page, along 
with their families, are hosting the reception.

Modern Club Hosts 
Genealogy Buff
Members and guests of Modern 

Study Club enjoyed a program 
about genealogy on Tuesday 
evening, November 15 at the 
Women’s Club House.

Beth Thompson presided in the 
absence of club president, Iona 
Cook. Fay Reeve opened the 
meeing with a prayer, and the 
Federation Report was given by 
Gerry Taylor.

Special music was presented by 
Mindy Johnson who sang “ A 
Touch of Texas” by McHugh, 
“ The Alamo” by Fox and “ There 
Will Always Be A Texas” by 
Cherette. Mindy was accompanied 
on the piano by Nelda Ellis.

Roll call was answered with “ A

Skeleton In My Closet.”
Carol Ellis, guest speaker, 

presented a talk entitled “ Dead 
Relatives Are The Best Kind 
Because They Don't Come To 
Visit.” The talk was followed by a 
question and answer session on the 
“ how to’s” of family history 
research.

Guests were Mindy Johnson, 
Nelda Ellis, Carol Ellis, Edith 
Johnson, Ann Spring, Lauretta 
BrookField and Connie Johnson.

The meeting was closed with 
Ann Nichols leading the group in 
the Club Collect.

Hostesses, Alio Reeve and Lois 
Norwood, served spice cake, tea 
and coffee 4o seventeen members 
and truest*.

b MADE IN
*U SA *

HOOVER » 
Elite™

Lightweight
Brushed edge clesnlrvg 
both skies
Top-fill eesy chei>ge beg 

’ HtadllfM

*4 carpet Haight Adjustments

THESE FRIENDLY CLOVIS MERCHANTS
\

INVITE YOU TO SHOP WITH THEM 

WHEN YOU ARE IN CLOVIS, N. MEX.

'V 'iv\ ‘

* At
’ ' . ' N« . \ v  '  •

N

■»• U4471

NOW
ONLY

$119

HOOVER*
two-speed
Quik-BroorrTII
Vacuum
Great for Quick Pick-Ups!

$39

H O O V E R *
Concept One™
Self-Propelled
Upright
with
P ow er Surge M
• 16 qt. top filling bag 

system
• Cleans any carpet - 

shags, tool*
• Dirt-finder headlight
• Cord reel rewind control

With Attachments

Now
Only

*

GAILAN ADAMS

C o u n try  C ra fts

& Gfa
2>e/on Cot*

*
Craft Supplies Class Instruct)* 

Delivery Available

#9 Highland Shopping Center 
Main & Manana 
Clovis, NM 88101 
(505)762-2227

(505) 762-0524 
(505) 763-7016

Bus. (505)762-4511
3400 MABRY DRIVE • CLOVIS. NEW MEXICO 88101

OLDSMOBJLE • CADILLAC • CHRYSLER .  PLYMOUTH .  DODGE

LVNN  T R A N SP O R T A T IO N  ™  1
Truck 8rokers

P.0 BOX 492 • CLOVIS, NM 08102-0492

Photo World
801 N. Prince 

Clovis, NM 88101 BOB’S UPHOLSTERY, INC.
1 1 0 3  T h o r n t o n  

CL-o v i e .  n m  e e i o i

( 5 0 5 ) 7 6 2 - 7 B 3 6

Dixi Martin
Owner

(505) 762-5353
J O H N  T H O R N T O N

\

U3319-900

$26995
HOMETOWN
HARDWARE

1002 N. Main 247-2468

V M Z W tc
v ' ' ~ cA

Bud & Phyllis Queener 311 Main Street 
Phone (505) 762-1691 Clovis, N .M . 88101

s -

LA RUE JEWELRY & MFG.
Doyal G. LaRue

102 W. 5th • Clovis - 763-3354

CLOVIS GLASS & MIRROR CO.

AUTO GLASS •  SHOWER DOORS
CO M M ERC IAL STORE •  STORM DOORS 8 f 
FRONTS W INDOWS •
PLATE GLASS •  STAINED GLASS.
M IRRORS * & SUPPLIES J

NM LIC. I  400 CO M M ERCE WAY - CLOVIS „
#  25414 I  EM ERGENCIES ONLY 985-2321 

1 JERRY TROLLINGER, OWNER

Owners: Ralph Balfanx 
and James Carmack
Ph. 763-7152'

CARMACK & SONS, INC
.314 M A I N  CLOVIS. N. M .- .......—

“The men’s store where women Qke to shop99
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H. Fortenberry, W. 
Exchange Wedding

Baker
Vows

Heather Fortenberry and 
William Kenneth Baker, Jr. 
exchanged wedding vows August 
20 at 4 p.m. in Canyon, Texas.

The ceremony was performed in 
St. Paul’s Lutheran Church by 
Ken Burkhard, pastor.

The bride is the daughter of Don 
Fortenberry of Friona and Ann 
Fortenberry of Colchester, 
Connecticut.

The bridegroom is the son of 
William Kenneth and Patricia 
Yvonne Baker of Rockwall, Texas.

Attendants were Don and Ann 
Fortenberry, Nita Fortenberry, 
cousin of the bride, Rusty 
Campbell, Ken and Pat Baker, 
Lynne Turley and Rusty, sister and 
nephew of the groom, Ken and 
Mila Burkhard.

The male attendants wore ivory 
rose boutonnieres and the female 
attendants wore gardenia corsages.

The church altar was decorated

with English ivy and ivory tapers.
The bride was attired in an off 

white dress with crocheted lace at 
the shoulders and midline. She 
carried a bouquet of ivory roses, 
yellow lily and wheat.

The bride’s mother wore a 
mauve formal length dress.

The groom’s mother wore a blue 
floral formal length dress.

The reception was held at Steak 
’n Ale in Amarillo.

The couple resides in Canyon.
The bride is a 1982 graduate of 

Friona High School and attended 
West Texas State University, 
majoring in education. She is 
employed at Horace Mann Middle 
School in Amarillo.

The bridegroom attended Allen 
Military Academy in Bryan- 
College Station, Texas. He is 
currently a graduating senior at 
West Texas State University in 
wildlife biology. Mr. and Mrs. William Baker, Jr.

Wilkins, Townsend 
TWOD Conference

Happy
Birthday

WEEK OF NOVEMBER 19-25
November 19-Frances Baker, 

Betty Lewellen, Lee Gibson, 
Brandon Lee Wilkins, Joe Aguirre, 
Roque Mendez.

November 20—Bobby Jordan, 
Celia Loflin, Burk Vestal.

November 21-Alicia Rapp, 
Tommy Brockman, Penni 
Weatherly, Tommy Boeckman, 
Gail McNamara, Kyle Mills.

November 22-Sam Saiz,
Brandon Walker.

November 23-Clark Kaufmann, 
Denae Reeve, Jim Beard, Tom 
O’Brian, Dee Willard, Greg 
Martin.

November 24—Lora Mae
McFarland, Junior Mata, Kenneth 
McLellan, Angela Van
Valkenburg.

November 25-Ralph Wilson, 
John Tannahill, Laura Valentine, 
Eddie Wilson, Lucy Hinkle, Inez 
Wheeler, Gladys Day, Michelle 
Mendoza, Sharon Mills.

Rhonda Wilkins, supervisor of 
the Adolescent Substance Abuse 
Program of Central Plains 
MH/MR and Diane Townsend, 
coordinator of outpatient services 
for Central Plains MH/MR, 
recently attended the Texans’ War 
on Drugs Annual Adult 
Leadership Conference in Austin.

Over 200 concerned members of 
Texas communities, as well as 
individuals in the field of 
education, mental and physical 
health, government, business, and 
law enforcement came together to 
learn and share new drug use 
prevention strategies as well as 
hear representatives from the 
national arena.

Governor William P. Clements, 
Jr. addressed the conference 
during opening ceremonies, along 
with John C. Lawn, administrator 
of the Drug Enforcement 
Administration. Other keynote

speakers during the TWOD 
conference included Dr. Donald 
Ian Macdonald, special assistant 
to the president for Drug Abuse 
Policy, in addition to Dick Hays, 
director of the Drug Abuse 
Prevention Oversight Staff, U.S. 
Department of Education.

Headquartered in Austin, with 
regional offices throughout the 
state of Texas, Texans’ War on 
Drugs works in partnership with 
all segments of society in a united 
effort to raise public awareness of 
the harmful effects of drugs and to 
promote a drug-free lifestyle.

TWOD, the only statewide 
organization dedicated solely to 
drug use prevention, was 
inaugurated in 1980 by Governor 
Clements and was cited in 1987 as 
a model program by the National 
Association of State Alcohol and 
Drug Abuse Directors and the 
National Prevention Network.

Attend 
In Austin

For more information about 
Texans’ War on Drugs, write to 
11044-D Research Blvd., Suite 
200, Austin, Texas 78759, or 
phone (512) 343-6950.

Diana Medina 
Ends Basic

Army National Guard Pvt. 
Diana I. Medina, daughter of 
Bulmaro and Maria D. Medina of 
Friona, has completed basic 
training at Fort Jackson, South 
Carolina.

During the training, students 
received instruction in drill and 
ceremonies, weapons, map 
reading, tactics, military courtesy, 
military justice, first aid, and 
Army history and traditions.

She is a 1988 graduate of Friona 
High School.

VARIABLE 
RATE LOANS

0.95 %
R U R A L  R E A L  ESTATE

. 2 0 %
R U R A L  R ESID EN CE

Rates effective August I, 1988

■  LONG-TERM FINANCING UP TO 35 YEARS
■  PRE-PAYMENT WITHOUT PENALTY
■  ONE POINT CLOSING FEE
■  FUNDS HELD ACCOUNTS AVAILABLE
■  FIXED RATE LOAN PLANS ALSO AVAILABLE

We are strongly committed to real estate lending in Texas.

Federal Land Bank Assn, o f Muleshoe
Serving Parmer & Bailey Counties . t= t  

316 Main St. Muleshoe, Tx. Ph. 272-3010 ffnoK

ARE YOU A 
DISASTER PAYMENT 

RECIPIENT?
McCallum Agency

Bovina, Texas
IS NOW TAKING YOUR APPLICATION FOR

MULTI-PERIL 
CROP INSURANCE

FOR THE 1989 CROP YEAR AS 
REQUIRED BY TERMS OF THE

Drought Assistant Bill

CALL 2 3 8 -1 1 6 7

McCallum Agency

We're Celebrating

Our First % ' ' »

In Friona

$ / '  •* * • •• • « • •

* .  % * •
• • •

THANK YOU For Your Support During 

The Past Year and For Helping Us 

To Grow And Progress.

We Have Stocker and Feeder Cattle In Our Inventory. 

We Invite You To Drop By And Discuss Your Operation 

And Let Us Know What We Can Do To Assist You.

m r ii
CALL FOR BILL McCOY OR ROGER RAHLFS

Phone 295-3100

WEST PLAINS 
FEED YARD. INC
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CORN KING WHOLE 
FULLY COOKEDFRESH

U.S.D.A. GRADE A 
SHURFINE SELF-BASTING

WITH TENDER TIMER 16-22 LB. AVG

SHOP YOUR THRIFTWAY 
69 STORE FOR

•BUTTERBALL TURKEYS 
•DRY CURED HAMS

HOKMEl BLACK LABEL "THE SUNDAY BACON

SLICED BACON
HORMEL PORK SAUSAGE } 2 OZ LIN

U L' SIZZLERS !o 8: K
FULLY COOKED SMOKED

LOUIS RICH BNLS. FULLY COOKED TURKEY

n # t f c r  n H m j  3-5 lb. avg. .
HILLSHIRE FARMS LITTLE COCKTAIL

SMOKIES SAUSAGE
SUPER SELECT LEAN TRIM FRESH BUTT

1 LB
REG./POLISH . . PKG.

SHURFINE

DUNCAN HINES
R.T.S.

FROSTING
16*/* OZ. CAN

BUTTfR FLAVOR
DELUXE

*OUR CREAM 0

14 OZ. PKG. 
ANGEL FLAKE

16 OZ. CAN 
FOR DELICIOUS PIES

2 LB. BAG
SHURFINE POWDERED OR

Ubbu>
Ubby>
Ubby>

PUMPKIN POWOCREO
SUGAR

too-. NAIU1AI

COKESKLEENEX
DINNER

NAPKINS
50 CT. PKG.

CALIFORNIA

CREAM OF 
MUSHROOM

GOLDEN RIPE

LARGE STALKS

KRAFT MINIATURE 
OR JET PUFFED

OCEAN SPRAY

GOLDEN SWEET

BROWN ’n SERVE
ROLLS

WASHINGTON EX-FANCY DELICIOUS

ASSORTED 
BATH TISSUE

CHARMIN
4 ROLL PKG.

CALIFORNIA FRESH

COLORFUL FRESH 1 BUNCH WITH 
YOUR THANKSGIVING 

PURCHASES

BOUNTY Jumbo Roll

PAPER
TOWELS 7 «

ROUND/WIDE ASSTD 
SOLID DEODORANT

SURE
2 OZ. SIZE

SHAMPOO OR 
CONDITIONER

IVORY
15 OZ. BTL.

CAPLETS OR 
TABLETS

TOPPING

COOL-WHIP I ORIGINAL

I ALKA-SELTZER

ASSORTED

/ PHILADELPHIA 
I REG. OR LIGHT

CREAM CHEESE
8 OZ. PKG.

RHODES WHITE 
DINNER

ROLLS
36 CT. PKG.

BANQUET
MINCE OR PUMPKIN Phone 247-3914, 247-3913

SHURFINE
QUARTERED

BUTTER
1 LB. PKG.

KRAFT HALFMOON 
CHFDDAR OR COLBY

CHEESE
16 OZ. PKG.

Wl ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS...WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT
Hours: r

n M y 8 a.m. • 8 p.m. Weekdays I

I  ' C  Noon - 6 p.m. Sundays

BIRDSEYE

RN ON THE COB
\ 4 EAR PKG.

FW * ■■•WFFIUATED
W  ■ I f o o d s in c .

MEMBER STORE

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
NOVEMBER 20-26, 1988

Whipping

( . K l l f  A

u i i m  r * » t r u n » » 4
Hi.mi
Whipping *  
Cream ^

SHURFINE WHIPPING

— —

K/Otf Iv o r y
<tmorrc*+*


