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LOCAL VOTERS will be asked to 
vote next Tuesday on a proposed 
new constitution for the state of 
Texas.

A lot of time, money and effort has 
gone into the efort to devise a new 
constitution, but speaking as one 
voter I'm not sure the general public 
is ready to give a blanket okay to a 
new charter which many state 
leaders and organizations oppose, 
and many others do not even know 
all that could come out of the 
proposal.

Many opponents to the all-new 
charter have surfaced In recent 
weeks, including Governor Dolph 
Briscoe, the Texas County Judges 
and Commlsslones Assn., Texas 
Assn, of School Boards and a group 
called the "Citizens to Preserve the 
Texas Constitution."

The Governor warns that annual 
sessions, as called for in the new 
document, could lead to a state 
income tax. He warns against 
moving the state government 
toward patterning after the federal 
government.

State Comptroller Bob Bullock 
describes the finance article, to 
which the school leaders are 
opposed, as ‘‘A spook which will 
haunt us for many years."

Bullock says that re-evaluation of 
property as called for in the 
document will cause property tax 
across the state to increase more 
than 60 per cent on the tax rolls.

Some taxing officials have the 
opinion that all of our local tax rates 
could be determined by a central 
agency in Austin, should the new 
document be passed.

The new state charter would also 
give legislators a more liberal 
means of raising their own salaries. 
The legislature has been unsuccess­
ful in recent years to gain a pay 
raise through constitutional 
amendment means, and apparently 
have written in a way of raising their 
pay without submitting it to the 
voters.

Personally. we believe the 
legislators need a pay raise, but we
believe that they should get one after 
getting our vote along with a 
majority of other Texans.

-f •+• + ■+■
THERE ARE SOME things in the 
new charter which we like, but the 
more we hear about the "fine print" 
contents of the document, we cannot 
at this time recommend wholesale 
pasage of the new constitution.

To approve something of this 
magnitude would require days and 
possibly weeks of study.

Although most of us have been 
bombarded with material concern­
ing the constitution, it’s hard for the 
average voter to digest it all.

Most folks are inclined to vote 
against something that they do not 
thoroughly understand This might 
not be a bad idea on the constitution.

After all, we still manage to get by 
on the old one. We can still offer 
amendments when we want a 
change. We pretty well know where 
we stand on major issues under the 
old document, whereas under the 
new one, we re not so sure.

+ + + +
A FRIEND OF OURS, Melvin 
Young, former editor of the 
Hereford Brand who has been down 
at Seagraves the past couple of 
years, visited us on Wednesday of 
this week

Young was impressed with the 
way Frtona has grown, and In 
particular with the business expan­
sion along Highway 10. Since his last 
visit to Frlona, we had added new 
locations for Herring Implement 
Company, Parmer County Imple­
ment Co., Reeve Chevrolet-Olds, 
Piggly-WIggly, White’s Auto, 
Brockman Sales, Gibson’s, Circle K, 
Tasty Cream, Pioneer Cattle Order 
Buyers and Hl-Pro Feeds.

New businesses on Main Street he 
noticed were Perry’s and Ruthie's. 
We also added the new post office.

Young was of the opinion that 
Friona is still "on the grow," and 
that this is still one of the best areas

always glad to have our ideas 
confirmed by someone not quite so
biased

+ + + +

DALE CLEVELAND and Gene 
Strickland, former basketball stars 
for the Friona Chieftains, will line up 
against each other for the first time 
next Saturday night at the Amarillo 
College gym when AC opens its 
season against the Wayland College 
junior varsity

Dale Is playing for the Amarillo 
College Badgers this season, while 
Gene will be on the Wayland JV.

Several Friona fans should be 
interested in this particular game, 
with former stars on the court The 
return game will be played at 
Plainview January 10 Tipoff time is 
8 pm
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Voters To Scan 
Special B allot

Two changes will be evident when 
Friona voters join those from 
throughout the state Tuesday in 
voting on the proposed new state 
constitution.

One change will be the new 
opening time for the polls-7 a m., as 
opposed to 8 a m as in the past. 
Polls will be open for 12 hours, 7 a m. 
to 7 p.m.

Voting place will be the Friona 
Fire Department on Eighth Street. 
Mrs. Ray Landrum will serve as 
election judge for the Friona 
precinct.

For the first time, the ballot to be 
scanned by voters next Tuesday will 
be presented In both English and 
Spanish, as provided In recent 
legislation.

Polls will also be open at Black 
(Tri-County Elevator), Bovina 
(American Legion Hall); Farwell 
(County Courtroom); Lazbuddie 
(High School); Oklahoma Lane 
(Community Center); Rhea (Parish 
Hall) and Lakeview (Otho White- 
field home).

The ballot deals entirely with the 
proposal to replace the 100-year-old 
state constitution. The new docu­
ment has been divided into eight 
sections, and voters will be asked to 
vote on the eight separate parts. 
Presumably, if some propositions 
carry and others do not, those 
carrying may be incorporated as 
amendments to the present consti­
tution

Little has been heard about the 
new constitution until recent weeks, 
when a number of leaders and 
organizations have come out in 
opposition to the proposed new slate 
of laws.

Among those paired against It are 
Governor Dolph Briscoe and such 
organizations as the Texas County 
Judges and Commissioners Assn. 
The Texas Association of School 
Boards Is against the finance article 
(proposition five).

State representative Bill Clayton 
favors the new document, and has 
been stumping the state trying to 
sell it to political leaders

Bank Begins 
Promotion Series
Friona State Bank has become a 

member of a network of some fifty 
and more banks in this area which 
has launched a cooperative cam­
paign to educate their fellow citizens 
on the part banks as institutions and 
bankers as individuals play in the 
welfare and progress of the 
communities’they serve.

The network is composed of banks 
within the signal of the three 
Amarillo television stations from 
which the campaign, composed of a 
series of 30-second spots, is being 
broadcast.

The steering committee, com­
posed of a dozen bankers from towns 
within a 100-mlle radius of Amarillo, 
Is chaired by Robert Neelley, 
president of Friona State Bank. 
Oklahoma and New Mexico, as well 
as Texas, are represented In the 
network.

Network members are also 
provided with a variety of 
newspaper, counter display, outdoor 
poster, and radio adaptation 
materials for use in their own 
communities.

The general theme highlights 
specific enterprises in which 
bankers have made or are making 
substantial contributions in time, 
money, and personal sacrifice to 
benefit their areas.... "because we 
are a pa.t of this community... we 
had a hand in building it. Our 
families live here. We want to help 
make it better for all of us."

In succeeding spots, the messages 
will point up how depositors' money 
is loaned for business and home 
building, retail inventories, manu­
facturers’ raw materials, farm 
equipment, and public improve­

ments...all of which provide jobs 
and. at the same time, give residents 
of the community a wide choice of 
goods and services at reasonable 
prices and good quality.

Symbol of the network is a wagon 
wheel from a prairie schooner 
which, in its day. housed the entire 
social and economic community in 
which a family functioned. This 
symbol is accompanied by the 
signature, "Your Hometown Bank."

Creation and production of the 
television commercials and colla­
teral materials is being handled by 
Rosenwald Batson. Inc., advertising 
and public relations agency

5 r Stile Set 
On Wedne

The Hospital Auxiliary and 
Friends of the Library rummage 
sale is underway at the old Hut 
building on Main Street 

A special 5 cent sale has been 
announced for Wednesday, Novem­
ber 5. between the hours of 3 and 5 
p.m.

SPECIAL PEP RALLY
Next week’s pep rally will be held 

at 5:15 on the high school parking 
lot, it was announced by the FHS 
cheerleaders.

The rally is designed to give the 
Chieftains a sendoff for their game 
at Dimmitt. The townspeople are 
invited to the rally.

FIRST RSI F,...,Ernest Osborn, 
right, delivered the first bale of 
cotton In Friona for I#75. He brought 
the bale to Friona Formers Co-op 
Gin on Thursday, October M. Tom

Byars, left. Is gin manager. The bale 
weighed SOS pounds, came from 21H 
pounds of seed cotton. The first bale 
yielded 7M pounds of seed.

BREAKING GROUND....An official 
groundbreaking ceremony was held 
at the Friona Nursing Home site 
Tuesday morning. Left to right are

CHAS LOVELACE

*  *

Lovelace
Announces
Candidacy4/

Chas Lovelace who is serving as 
Sheriff of Parmer County, has 
authorized The Friona Star to 
announce his candidacy to succeed 
himself, subject to the Democratic 
Primary next May

In making public his candidacy for 
re-election. Sheriff Lovelace issued 
the following statement 

"In announcing my candidacy for 
nomination for the office of sheriff, 
subject to the will of the voters in the 
Primary in May, I wish to express 
my sincere thanks and appreciation 
to the people of Parmer County and 
the surrounding area for the 
cooperation given me * in the 
past and if elected I pledge my 
continued best efforts and full timd 
devotion to the duties of the office of 
Sheriff of Parmer County in the 
future I surely thank the people of 
Parmer County for allowing me to 
serve you "

"I shall appreciate your support."
Chas Lovelace

(Paid Political Advertisement)

Boosters To
I iG iiD i t l i t  A lt \
The Friona Booster Club will be 

host to the varsity football players at 
the regular meeting of the Club 
Tuesday night

We w ant to show the boys that we 
appreciate their efforts for the 1975 
season All funs are invited to attend 
the meeting." said a representative 
of the Bomters

Films of the "Red Rage" battle 
with Littlefield will be shown

St'lutol (h it Friday
There will be no school In 

Friona on F rlday, November 7 for 
students. Teachers will be 
attending the District XVI 
Teachers Convention In Amarillo.

June Spring, mayor R.L. Fleming, nine months to complete, and says 
Dr. Bob Alexander, Andy Hurst and he might beat that estimate If the 
Delton Lewellen, contractor. Lewel- weather Is favorable, 
len has estimated the job to take

Dan Carthel Wins 
Weekly Grid Event
Dan Carthel of Gruver was the 

winner in the eighth week of the 
Friona Star’s football contest The 
former Friona resident equalled the 
season high score of 19, and was the 
only one of 176 contestants to post a 
score of 19 for the week 

Carthel won the weekly first 
prize of $10 00 Fred Church and 
Jackie Clark tied for second place, 
the second straight week for a tie for 
those spots, and each was awarded 
$5 00

Church and Clark were among 
seven contestants who had 18 games 
right for the week. Others were 
Bobby Drake, Fred Barker, Jr., 
Owen Drake, Ricky Castaneda of 
Hereford and Benny Pryor.

The two prize winners missed the 
Friona-Olton game score by only 
three points each 

Twelve contestants had the score 
of 17. They were Eugene Guss, 
David Phelps. Leslie Broadhurst, 
Edward Castillo, Jay Beene. Mike 
Gowens. Toby Strickland, Harletta 
Carthel. Dor. Fortenberry, Clay 
Bandy. Terry Brown. Cindy Carthel 
and W L Cleveland 

Carthel’s score of 19 moved him up 
to fifth in the season standings, 
making his aggregate score 117 
Jack Clark, the leader, had a score 
of 15 for the week and now stands at 
121. Don Fortenberry is second at 
120 Clay Bandy. Bobby Drake and 
Mike Gowens are at 119 

Next at 118 come Fred Barker, Jr., 
Edward Castillo and Movelda 
Fortenberry.

A total of 107 contestants have 
already reached the 100 point 
plateau in the contest, which had 
five weeks remaining, counting the 
current weekend

A total of 1658 entries have been 
tabulated through eight weeks of the 
contest This is an average of 207 per

week. Fiv* new contestants entered 
last wee*. making a total of 28]
different contestants entering the
1975 event

Contestants are shooting for a 
grand prize of two tickets to the 1976 
Cotton Bowl Game plus $30 00 in 
cash, or for the runnerup, two 
tickets to the Sun Bowl Game and 
$20 00 in cash A third grand prize of 
$15 00 cash is also awarded 

In addition, a total of $20 00 in 
weekly cash prizes are awarded to 
the top three contestants

Carrothers
Named
Committee

Jack Carrothers, president of
Friona Industries, has been ap­
pointed to the Program and Budget 
Committee and the Consumer 
Education Committee of the 
National Live Stock and Meat 
Board

The appointments wore made and 
announced by Earl E Harriss, 
Chairman of the Meat Board.

Carrothers is an elected beef 
industry Director representing the 
state of Texas He has also 
represented the American National 
Cattlemen's Association on the Meat 
Board

He's a member of the Beef 
Industry Council, promotional divi­
sion of the Meat Board responsible 
for research, advertising, education 
and market projects for the beef 
industry.

RECEIVES CHECK...Davy Car- 
thel, right, Is being presented a 
check for $11.M from Vickie Copley 
of the Friona Star. Carthel accepted

the check on behalf of his brottor, 
Dan. of Gruver, who won first place 
In the Star’s weekly football contest

/
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P ick in g  Cotton
You were very proud of your first 

cotton ■.ack It was probably made of 
a four sack or burlap tow sack Your 
mom sewed a ducking shoulder
strap on it and you could hardly wait 
until you got to the field that day 
The sack seemed to get bigger the 
more cotton you put into it You kept 
pulling and pulling and glancing 
back to see if it was full. It took 
forever Finally, you had enough to 
weigh in Someone bigger had to

help you at the scales, they were too 
high to reach After it was weighed, 
they pitched your sack up into the 
wagon for you while you scrambled 
up to dump the cotton out. thinking 
about how much money you had 
already earned.

After you were older it was not as
much fun but the money was 
important. You graduated to a 

real' cotton sack, though a short 
one, usually made from a long one

• V
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that had worn out The worst thing 
about picking cotton would be kinda 
hard to pinpoint because there were 
so many things Your hands got sore 
to the point where they actually 
bled If you tried using gloves to 
save your hands, you couldn't pick 
as much cotton Your poor back 
would cramp and hurt from bending 
over the stalks and from pulling the 
heavy sack full of cotton If you tried 
working on your knees to relieve the 
back pain, your knees got raw from 
the hard clods, rocks and numerous 
goatheads.

There were rewarding things 
about picking cotton, though, in 
addition to the money, I mean You 
just might happen upon a good old 
volunteer watermelon vine that had 
a ripe one on it Stopping at the fence 
row to get a drink of water from the 
cloth-covered gallon water jug was 
good, too The short rows were good 
and sundown was good The final 
wtMgh in of the day was best of all. 
though

The scales were usually hung from 
a tripod situated by the wagon or 
maybe a board hanger fixed directly 
to the tall sideboards In the old days 
it was a balance scale, an iron bar 
with a heavy iron weight The weight 
was placed in notches along the bar 
until it came to rest in a level 
position. The notch showed how 
much the cotton weighed. You then 
deducted some amount for the 
weight of the sack and the tally 
keeper put down the net amount 
beside your name. At the end of the 
day. if you were really lucky, you got 
to go with the cotton to the gin.

( rum* Hunt Begins 
Sat. At Mules hoe

The annual Sandhill Crane Hunt at 
the Muleshoe National Wildlife 
Refuge, located about 20 miles south 
of Muleshoe, will get underway this 
weekend and continue the next two 
weekends.

Sponsored by the Muleshoe 
Jaycees, headquarters for the hunt 
will be the Corral Restaurant at 1008 
West American Blvd. in Muleshoe.

Charge for participating In the 
hunt, w hich begins SO minutes before 
sunrise, will be S7.S0 per day, $14 for 
a weekend, S25.S0 for two weekends, 
or $37.50 for all three weekends. 
Breakfast is included In the hunting 
fee and will be served at 4: SO each 
morning. Permits will be provided 
and hunting licenses and shotgun 
shells will be available.

Trap shoots will be featured every 
day of the hunt. In addition, Ihree 
drawings for Winchester 12-gauge 
shotguns will be conducted 

Hunters wishing further Informa­
tion may contact Mike Armstrong or 
Hugh Young In Muleshoe.
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WELCOME TO FRIONA

Recent newcomers to Friona ere
Mr **<(< Mrt TV#

die Friona Apartments, Number Jl. 
He It employed as a highway 
Mlrnlmin for (he Oenortment of

Public Safety They came here from
f  I W H I  w h le h  f t  th e  h e m e t o w e  t f

Dei Kio. lhey attend the Catholic 
Church.

| BROCKMAN 
SALES

Automotive l'nri< And 
Irrigation Slippliea

HOUSER
GROCERY & MARKET

ROCKWELL BKOS. 
| AM) CO.
| ‘LUMBERMEN*

Lumber, Paint & Tools

REEVE CHEVROLET
Nfv Ami [ mm! ( nr*

FM<;il>\IKE APPLIANCES

Friona Flashbacks
....from the files of The Friona Star

4$ YEARS AGO-NOV. 14,10S0
Friona is going to have a boy scout 

troop and in short time we will see 
these lads walking along our streets 
in uniform E L Price is responsible 
for the movement. He has had three 
years experience as scoutmaster in 
Lockney, and he will likely make a 
success of it here. The boys meet 
Monday evening at the barber shop 
for an organization meeting and are 
showing much interest.

+ + + +
40 YEARS AGO-NOV. 8 ,19S5

Dr. E B Wills, dentist, who has 
been in Friona for the past few years 
closed his dentist office here and 
moved with his family to some place 
near Waco, where he intends to open 
an office.

The Friona Chiefs are to make 
their first trip for a football game 
this Friday. They are to play Claude 
in the afternoon. This will also be the 
first game they have played in the 
afternoon as they have been taking 
advantage of the floodlights.

+ + + +
35 YEARS AGO-NOV. 8, 1040

A move is now on foot to secure at 
an early date, several more miles of 
paved highways for Parmer County. 
The new paving as now outlined will 
include the paving of State Highway 
86. which traverses the county east 
and west from Dimmitt in Castro 
County, to Bovina, where it 
intersects Highway 33-60 The other 
highway, which the new i„ jve 
proposes to pave, is the new State 
Highway, which connects Muleshoe. 
in Bailey County, with Friona. 
traversing the county from south to 
north

+ + + +
25 YEARS AGO-NOV. 2, ItSO

C W, Dixon is reported still in 
serious condition in the hospital in 
Roswell, undergoing an operation 
Tuesday and facing another one in 
the near future Mr. Dixon, father of 
Mrs Ray Landrum, was injured 
three weeks ago when working 
cattle on his ranch near Roswell. 
Though not thrown, he was severely 
injured internally as the horse 
pitched with him,

•F -F ■+■ +
20 YEARS AGO-NOV. 4,1055

The newly-built Sixth Street 
Church of Christ structure is one of 
the latest contributions to the Friona 
building scene, providing another 
modern church in a town of 
outstanding churches. Completed 
this month, the building is

beautifully designed and con­
structed. inside and out.

Next election, in 1956, will find 
Parmer County residents voting for 
a new county elective office, that of 
County Tax Assessor and Collector. 
In a special election this Tuesday, 
the new office was authorized by one 
of the narrowest margins in local 
voting records. 97 affirmative and 81 
against. Friona sanctioned the 
division by a slim 21-19 vote, with 
Farwell polling the heaviest ballot 54 
for, 23 against the measure. The new 
office calls for a four year term, 
same as that of the sheriff Mr. 
Lovelace will hold both positions 
until the 1957 term begins.

+ + + +
15 YEARS AGO-NOV. S, I960

Two men were injured Monday 
afternoon in an explosion and fire at 
the Plains Farmer Gin on the Bovina 
Highway. Jack Dickerson was 
treated at Parmer County Commu­
nity Hospital for burns and 
lacerations. His father Allan 
Dickerson was treated and released 
from the hospital The younger man 
required hospitalization for his 
injuries, which included second and 
third degree burns on the arm and 
lacerations on the face and ear. 
Firemen were called to the gin 
following the blast, which apparent­
ly started from a butane leak in a 
pilot on one of the gin's cotton 
dryers Damage to the gin was not 
believed extensive.

Friona's High School Band will 
take part in Homecoming activities

| School j 
f M enus f

Week of November 3-7
MONDAY-enchilada casserole, 

buttered corn, crackers, cabbage 
and carrot salad, peaches and milk.

TUESDAY-meat loaf, mashed 
potatoes, hot rolls-butter, green 
beans, brownies and milk

W FDNESDAY-burritos with chili 
and cheese, pinto beans, cornbread- 
butter, lettuce and tomato salad, 
pineapple rice pudding and choco­
late milk.

THURSDAY-hamburgers. let­
tuce, tomatoes, pickles, onions, 
French fries, fruit jello, catsup and
milk

FRIDAY-No School Friday--Dis* 
trict Teachers Meeting.

Saturday at Eastern New Mexico 
University in Portales ENMU will 
take on Southwestern Oklahoma in 
the football contest that will 
highlight activities of the day. 
Friona's band will take part in a 
downtown parade at 11 a m. and 
then perform at halftime.

+  + +  +
10 YEARS AGO-NOV. 4 ,IM5

Friona's district alignment for 
1966 and 1967 has been announced 
Hale Center and Memphis, both of 
which are moving up to class AA 
from A will be in Friona’s district, 
competing along with the six teams 
which were already in the district. 
Bovina and Morton, neither met 
during the last two seasons, will be 
played as non-conference games 
Muleshoe, Dalhart and Plains, 
played this year, will not appear on 
the 1966 slate

■f +  +■ F
5 YEARS AGO-NOV. 5,1970

Friona voters gave a wide margin 
to Governor Preston Smith in his 
re-election bid. gave Lloyd Bentsen 
an eyelash margin, and went 
overwhelmingly against liquor-by 
the-drink in Tuesday’s election 
Smith had the majority in Friona. 
with 523 votes to 314 for Republican 
Paul Eggers. Bentsen edged out 
Bush in the Friona box, 421 415.

City Receives 
Sales Tax ('heck

Comptroller Bob Bullock mailed 
checks totaling $14.2 million last 
week to 824 Texas towns and cities 
for their monthly October city sales 
lax rebate.

The October payments were 
smaller than the previous month's. 
Bullock said this is because the 
September checks included receipts 
carried over or coming in late from 
the last round of quarterly tax 
payments sent in by merchants

During the first two months of 
each three-month cycle, he noted, 
payments are not made to cities 
whose allocation is less than $500

Bullock said the monthly rebate 
program has proven a boon to cities 
in its first several months of 
operation.

Friona's monthly tax check 
amounted to $3,442.75. The payment 
was based on a gross amount of 
$3,688.58, less a state service fee of 
$73.77.

The pioneers brought here with them all they could of civilization. In 
their covered wagons, they literally included their world, as they came to 
settle this vast and em pty plains country  a century ago.

Because there were so few of them , neighbors were treasured. It was 
a comfort to know that help would come, should the need arise.

And as they tended their herds ... broke the sod ... built their 
towns, bankers were there, to be relied on.

As your Hom etow n Bank, we were formed in this tradition. We are

families live here. We want to help make it better for all of us.

w h e r e  y o u r

F r i o n a  s t a t e B a n k

|

l



THE FRIONA STAR, SUNDAY, NOVEMBER 2, 1975, PAGE 3

M embers Exhibit 
Winning Anim ats

Three Parmer County 4 H 
members from the Lazbud 
die club exhibited their 
barrows at the State Fair of 
Texas in Dallas on October 
13-17. These youngsters 
were Russell Windham, 
Sherrie Seaton and Barbara 
Seaton. Over seven hundred 
barrows from throughout 
the state were entered and 
shown before Jim McMani- 
gal. West Texas State 
University who served as 
show judge.

The barrows were shown 
on Wednesday and Thurs­
day, with Sherrie Seaton 
placing her heavyweight 
crossbred third on Wednes­
day afternoon. Thursday 
was a better day for all the 
youngsters. Barbara Seaton 
started off the Hampshire 
show by having the first 
place lightweight. Russell 
Windham came through in 
the mediumweight Hamp­
shire class by placing first 
and ninth with his two 
barrows. Russell's heavy­
weight Duroc also placed 
ninth

In the Poland China show, 
Sherrie placed second with 
her mediumweight followed

by Barbara in third with her 
mediumweight Poland.

This show concluded the 
Fall Circuit for 4-H young 
sters in the county

The group was accom­
panied to Dallas by Mack 
Heald and Jimmie Seaton of 
l.azbuddie.

Out of^rbit

Ib tT  JJTHOUSAND *H(S PER 
6AU0N OUT OF COMPACT'*.

SS Recipient May
Get Extra Benefits

"A person who delays 
retirement beyond age 65 
may be eligible for a higher 
benefit,” Jose A Martinez, 
social security field repre­
sentative said recently.

“To be eligible, a worker 
must be between ages PS and 
72, and not have received a 
full social security check 
before age 65. The Increase 
In benefits Is 1-12 of I per 
cent for each month a check 
is not paid after age 65. The 
higher benefits are effective 
January of the following 
year.

"No request need be filed 
to get the delayed retire­
ment credit. This is auto­
matically done each year.

and the increase-back to 
January of that year -is 
usually reflected in the 
check for August or Sep­
tember.

"An individual should 
contact social security when 
he is approaching 65 even 
though he doesn't plan to 
retire,” Martinez stressed 
“He should apply for

Medicare even if he doesn't 
plan to receive monthly 
retirement checks until 
later using his Medicare 
card will not prevent him 
from becoming eligible for 
the delayed retirement 
credit," Martinez ex­
plained

in-MKTION
By MILTON EVANS 

Parmer County Farm Bureau Insurance 
Phone 247-3280 

A t  w h a t  age  a m  I ab le  to  s ta r t  re c e iv in g  b e n e f i t s  f r o m  
th e  i n d iv id u a l  R e t i r e m e n t  A c t?  A re  th e  e a rn in g s  
ta x a b le ?  W i l l  I be ab le  to  b o r r o w  o n  t h i s  a c c o u n t?
Under IRA you may begin to receive benefits at age 59''i If you 
become disabled these funds are available at time of disability The 
funds are available to beneficiaries at time of death As with most 
savings instruments, there are penalties it the funds are withdrawn 
prior to these three circumstances The interest earnings are not 
taxable you are earning interest which is tax free, as opposed to 
money in regular savings accounts You cannot borrow on the 
account or use the money as security m obtaining a loan IRA's 
purpose is to assure you retirement security with money that is well 
pro tected and available only m the appropriate circumstances

7777777777777

Buick - G M C  - Pontiac

John Orsborn
Buick - G M C  - Pontiac

25 Years In Hereford 

See Us And SAVE
1 4 2  M i l e s  S t - H e r e f o r d - P h o n e  3 6 4 - 0 9 9 0

TIUEEZ
COMPOST MANURE 

•* VOT M AMTDAII Ch

★  NATURAL ORGANIC 
SOU CONDITIONER

★  NO MANURE ODOR

★  NO CHEMICAL ADDITIONS
MEW PUNT ATSUMMERnilOTEUS 

CM1

BOB HARDY & SONS
PN O M  357 2515

^ S d c ' E m  O ff  O u r S h e lv e s !
r t U f t t i i s

SKOALS GOOD 
WEEK OF 

NOVEMBER3 
THRO

NOVEMBER I

RED
[eizl

^ M E A T ' S  

SHURFRESH

BOLOGNA and 
V  W  FRANKS

12 0Z 
PKG.

SHURFRESH

CANNED ££7Q ^  
HAMS >» O

G n a t Food B u ys
KING SIZE

COCA 
COIA f

RUSSETT

p (.
SHURFRESH

6 BOTTLE CARTON

tOUMC VUMMIV 10 To 
16 IB

PUIS DEPOSIT

(KCO*

SHURFRESH 
VAC SLICED PACK

POTATOES
n r  8 9 *

SNOWDRIFT

B A C O N * 1 W  SHORTENING
SHURFRESH

LUNCH MEATS
ASST 6 02 PKG

3 LBS.

:

NOTEBOOK FILLER 300 CT

F t .

| AIM URGE m j t k

TOOTHPASTE 6 9 * ®  A lm FlUORIOC

fine Sol
PINE-SOL

4 0 0 2

1
TIDE

w r  giant

I f ; "  SHURFRESH
i MpSALTINE CRACKERS m

SHURHHE

t0 M a t o  JUICE

4602 .
CAN

MED
■SXUf 4 U A L IT Y

3 1 FROZEN FOODS 
SNURFWE PRE-COOKED

H$H STICKS ioz 3/*1 
ORANGE JUICE 5/*1

SHURHNE 300 CAN M  I  tM  IBROCCOU SPEARS tO 02
PORK 'N BEANS 9 /  1 irou»RSroogTS »« 

sHMfiNcORANGE c u tm r n ™ ”4̂02 ft p ill 1/ CUT CORN
CAN MKor )  PKGS

(  I  MATCH FOR

V  "'T /.-'A .

r  10.w .J »>*/ 2 8 9

SUNN

HOUSER
GROCERY & MARKET

A f f l f t i t u d  Feedi

o T o T o

PHONE
2473343

M IU K tK U n

MILK
e 1

FOR I B
GOODNESS
Tendercrust Bread

II
/ /
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Reader Ads--F Irst insertion, per * ord 8 cents
Additional insertions (no copy change 1, per word

6 cents
Minimum charge $1.25
Classified display (boxed ads—9 pt. type under a 

specific heading, 1 column width only-no art or 
cuts. Per column inch $1.50

Repeat insertions without copy change per column 
inch $1.25

Cards of I hanks—same as classified word rate, 
minimum charge $1.25

DC \I)I INC for classified advertising in Sunday’s
issue-6 p.m. Thursday.

(heck advertisement and report any error 
immediately; The Star is not responsible for error 
after ad has already run once.

ANNOUNCEMENTS

+ Birthdays 
4 Weddings 

4- Anniversaries 
-f House Warmings 

Water colors by Carol Ellis 
at the Star Art Gallery, 916 
Main Small original art 
gifts and unframed paint­
ings priced under $10 00 
Macrame plant hangers by 
Laura Coffey

#\ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ w \ «

/  OUTSIDE P AINTING... £
4 houses, barns, tanks 
2 * 

I
FOR RF'NT....Vacation or 
hunting trip by day or week 
24 1972 Concord Motor 
Home Fully equipped 
Sleeps 6 Phone 364 6530 

-

&
s
/
\

Needlepoint & Supplies 
Still Stocked at 

AL! C VS JC W El RY
3-tfnc

h

H I  S I  \  E S S  D I

I m a m s  d r iu in g  c o , in c
W J .  WATER WEU DRIWN6
I  U fN  l*c h w j  t  Ctir

|  U m i * c t p i i W i n  NtU

L s * t  ft Sonritt w
* Gill 247 2731 

K  k M m i  T tm

FARM SALES
★  FRET APPRAISALS
★  GUARANTEE ALL CHECKS
BARTLETT *  POTTS

S i t  AT 814 DICKS

TELEX
( i .m  i i k a k i m ; v ii> < k m k h

HEARING AIDS
♦ l i a i i r r i r *  ♦ M o ld * *  I- ret* l l r u r in g  I »•»('»

SKRM CK C U. M CkKS
tO J E M H i PHONE 743 6900 t t f m

friona bi-product*
I1 o r  7 th is  it H eck  «I «*i i «I s lo c k  / 

r t * im » \a l  ( n i l  2 l7 - .B T . i2  ( o l l r r l  A

A #l .............  ~  " ....... ~ j
IC T t^  f  T i l  r  f  I I  T

W i lv *

Ar t

i t  New S c l f c l io i i '

♦ Ik rtfrr 1 olor*

n% ,

DIRT WORK
Malntainer, Dozer, Scraper.

I and 1 evelllng. Dikes, Drainage Ditches. 
Private Roads. 4- Pits Dug and backfilled.

4- \ ards raised or lowered.

FORREST 0S80RN 24725*1  
CARL OSBORN 247-33S2

47 tfnc

*  «o -at-
NOW .....In friona. You f  
can come direct to us * 
and discuss a mortgage j| 
loan, or a home im- 1 
provement loan, l.et us * 
visit with you on an> i  
financial question you Q 
might have. Tri-County I  
Savings At Loan. 106 West w 
Ninth. I riona 16 tfnc I

tb  -M. JK. --M.- A

gf F riona 1 odge No. 1332 
7th & Ashland 

T Slated Meeting
*3 MKDk  IstTuesdav 

“  . .  a
ts rs rs rs :3 rs L '£ rs ra n

Varner. 247 3132

Furniture Refinishing
1 block south of Black Store 
Call 265 3857 3-3tc

mac
Come in now for your 
Christmas portraits, and 
see our selection of 
frames. See
our wall groupings and 
unique framing Ideas. 

Pat Shafer’s Photo 
21* W 2nd

Muleshoe, Texas 79347 
Phone H04 272-3487

3-tfnc

Friona Ind School District 
has a 1964 Dodge 60
Passenger School Bus for 
sale Bus may be inspected 
at the Friona School Bus 
Barn Interested bidders 
should submit a sealed bid 
to Tom B Jarboe. Box 607, 
Frkm*. T*-xas '9035 Bids 
will be opened on Monday. 
November 10. 1975 at 8 00 
A M The school reserves 
the right to reject any or all 
bids 4 2tc

1 will do light sewing in my
home Call Mrs Andy 
Hernandez. 247 3347 or come 
by Frmna Apts No 31

4-2tp

DR AGI.INF
Tailwater p 
Joe Sears

SF R VICE.2
its cleaned ^ 
Phone 247-* 

4 4tc 3
rx i n m i r m m x r t

FEDERAL

FIRST FIDfRAl 
SAVINGS

M lUI

801 Pile St.

IT*.o75 7 6 2 -4 4 1 7

Clovis New M exico

AUTOMOTIVE

FOR SALE....Low mileage 
Pinto Take up payments 
Call 247-3541 or 247-3762

5-tfnc

FOR SALE....1974-750 Hon 
da Fully dressed, in good 
condition Call 265 3662 or 
247 3998. 5-tfnc

I

FOR SALE....1975 Ford 
Pickup FI00 300 C.I D.. six 
cylinder engine, HD. 3 
speed, radio, heater, only 
11.000 miles. All smog 
equipment removed. This 
pickup is in A-l condition 
Color is white. Phone 
247 2881 or mobile 265 3664 

5-4tc

J1

FOR SALE....1970 Cadillac 
Also, framed box springs 
and mattress. Phone 247- 
3114 5-2tc

COTTON TRAILF R TIRES
for sale 78 series-14" and 
15". $3 00 each; radials. 
$4 00 each Call Eugene 
Ratliff. 817-897-2840 Glen 
Rose. Texas. 5-4tp

FOR SALE....1974 Vega GT 
with hatchback, automatic 
transmission, air condition­
er 10.000 miles Phone Jim 
at (505) 763-5524 3-tfnc

FOR SALE
FOR SALE....15 inch well 
casing New steel 17*.̂  cents 
lb We bey scrap iron No. 1. 
$45 00 a ton. No 2. $30 00 a 
ton Junk motors. $42 00 a 
ton Farwell Pipe and Iron. 
601 Avenue A. Farwell. 
Texas Call 481 3287 3-tfnc

FOR SALE....Two 1971 6600 
diesel combines with or 
without corn heads. Call 
295-3686 49 tfnc

FOR SALE....1974 Inter­
national combine, model 

1975 Dri All Grain 
Dryer. m<»del 28 A Tempte 
belly-dump trailer Inter­
national diesel truck Phone 
26 5 3 291. 2-tfnc

FOR SALE....One 6-row 
Heath Barnes beet topper 
and wmdrower Fits 30 
rows In good operating 
condition Call S L Garri­
son 806 2765221 2 4tc

FOR SALE....Trampoline. 2 
Daytona Sport 60 mag 
wheels L 60 15. 10” appli 
ance 1202 Columbia Call 
247-3359 after 6 p m 5-3tc

COMPUTE RESIDENTIAL 
BUILDING

NEW REMOOEL OR ADD-ON ALSO DO 
PIASTER WORK IMITATION BRICK, 
PAINTING TEXT0NE AND CONCRETE 

WORK

CAU CHRIS CHAVEZ 

CLOVIS H M

SOS 762 6S76 tr SOS 762 S tIO

SECURITY GUARDS
Must have car, telephone, good record. 
Three shifts. Contact Sgt. James Davis 
at Missouri Beef Packers. Call 295-3201, 
Ext. 30 for appointment.

I -tfnc

FOR SALE....1973 Chevrolet 
Suburban Loaded, trailer 
towing, cruise control, etc. 
Jerry Fancher. 247-3577.

2-tfnc

Your
R ADIO SH ACK 

Dealer In Friona 
Is W hlte’s Auto 

We Have ( B Radios
22-tftc

FOR SALE....1962 Buick. 
$175 00 See Bill Collins at 
Friona Consumers or Space 
22, Friona Mobile Estates 
after 6:30 5-3tc

CARPET SALE
This ad good for SI.00 per yard off of 
any carpet in our store.

TEXAS CARPET
DEAN LONDON

!I0« W 43th St.-Amarlllo J52 S22* 5-4tc

i j
P
|
i
p

FOR SALE....Good used 
Wurlitzer Piano. Reason 
able Call 247-2579 5-ltC

Friona. Nearly 
piano. Concert

For Sale In
new spinet 
approved. Tremendous 
Bargain. This is your 
chance to own a fine piano 
by assuming small pay­
ments W'rite at once- 

McFarland Music Co 
1401 West 3rd 

Elk City. Okla 73644
5*1 tp

FOR SALE OR TRADE 
FOR CORN cattle Several 
hundred for feedlot, stalks, 
wheat Reasonable Call or 
see Leo Ruzicka Day or 
night--!806) 265 3250 3-tfnc

mm
GARAGE SALE.... "Little 
White House.” four miles 
east on FM Road 2397. 
Monday, November 3 only, 9 
a m. 5 p.m. Clothing, some 
furniture, little of every­
thing. 5-ltc

HELP WANTED
HF.t P
pm - 
Allsup 
Friona

WANTED — For II
’ a m. shift Apply at
s Convenience Store.

45-tfnc

WUTRFSS WANTED.......
Apply in person. FRIONA 
SNACK BAR Located in 
Malouf’s Shopping Center 

51 -tfnc

FOR SALE....Will Barley 
Cleaned, sacked and treat 
ed Joel Landrum. 247-3536 

3-tfnc

FOR SALE....Open gilts, 
mixed breed About 200 
pounds each, Stanley 
Bishop. Phone 295-6135

5-tfnc

IMMF 1)1 ATF OPENINGS
If you qualify, we’ll teach 

you a job, pay you while you 
learn, and give you one of 
the best benefit packages 
anywhere. Then you’ll earn 
your keep and know a job. 
Join the people who’ve 
joined the Army.

Call 806 376-2181 or 
806 353-1286 
in Amarillo

5- He
FOR SALE....Fertilizer 
plow Roll-A-Cone. 2-bar. 21 
ft with 13 chisels and dual 
guage wheels. Call 247-3185.

4 tfnc

OARAGE SALE
GARAGE SALE....80S West 
5th. November l and 2. 
Saturday and Sunday. 5-ltp

WANTED....Fry cook Eve­
ning shift, 2 till 10 Apply in 
person Earl’s Parmer 
House Restaurant. West 
Highway 60 1-tfnc

Phipps & Sons Associates is 
now taking applications for 
truck drivers and heavy 
equipment operators. Call 
247 3404 3-tfnc

GARAGE SAIF....Lots of 
bargains Monday and 
Tuesday. November 3 and 4 
1106 Etta. 5-ltc

GARAGE SALF 
1204 Jackson 

F rid ly and Saturday 
November 7 and 8

5-ltp

GARAGE SALE....Saturday 
and Sunday. November 1-2 
New 30.000 BTU space 
heater Motorcycle header 
pipes Lineman s belt and 
pole gappers Antique R C 
Allen adding machine. 
Men’s flying coveralls 
Welding hood and vest. 
Clothing, etc. 1107 Virginia 

5-tfnc

Urgently need experienced 
pen riders Good salary, 
group health insurance 
available. Call 806 265 3433 
or 265-3633. 4-4tc

LOST & FOUND

LOST....Steer, branded 88 
on left hip Call MBPXL. 
Inc., 295-3201 3-tfnc

STRAYED....5 steers br 
anded on left shoulder , 
with two notches out of left 
ear Weigh approximately 
550 to 600 lbs Last seen in 
vicinity of Friona Feed 
Yard Call Lawrence Mar­
tin. 247-3878 50-tfnc

P h ip p s  &  S o n
H e n e r a l  C o n t r a c t o r

F i cava ting I e ve ling 
Pits ( leaned Dirt A Callcne Hauled 

Phone Friona 247 3404
tfnc

r V K  M l  W U K  r n U V IN Ir
NEEPS

it  TAILWATER PITS 
it  LAN P LEVELING 

it  ENSILAGE PITS it  PAMS
K  YEARS IN  THIS A R EA

M 0 L0W0RN
B O X 544 FARWELL TEXAS

O R  C A U m 4419024

NOTHING NEEDED!
We sell service. And because we sell service, we 
never have a shortage. You are the reason why we 
are In business and we wouldn’t want It any other 
way. Thanks.

Prestige Unlimited Is available to you with the 
ownership of this beautiful Spanish style brick 
home. Located on this addition’s largest lot, It Is 
elegant In every respect. Just a few of the extras 
are plush carpeting, fireplace, custom draperies, 
an up-to-date kitchen, double car garage, over 800 
square feet In basement, and easy financing. Price, 
$45,000.00.

Assumption Buy--Thls brick 3 BR-P« BA home has 
a 7 per cent Interest rate and payments (Including 
taxes and Insurance) of only $lH5-month. Another 
plus factor, this home Is located In one of Frlona’s 
newest neighborhoods. Price to sell at $30,000.00.

Down Payment Only $1,100 on this two bedroom 
home. Very livable. Monthly pay ments, Including 
taxes and Insurance, only $53. Total price, $5,500.00.

“Service” is our only Business”

CARROL GATtlN LAND ( O
102 F. 11 IK orriev HOC 247-2745

i m o w  tkxas :sois

B.K. Burke 
806 247 250$

I OST....Australian shep
herd Eight weeks old, has a 
bobbed tail. Reward of­
fered Call 247 3038 5 Itp

FOR SALE....I story- 
house . three bedrooms, 2 
baths. basement. Fully 
carpeted Call 247-2226 after
riptn 48 tfiu

FOUND....One dog. You 
describe it and you can have 
it. Call 265-3420 5-2tc

PETS

FOR SALE....Registered St 
Bernard and Registered 
Bassett Hound Both ARC 
registered Call 265-3319

4 2tp

WANTED
I will do poodle grooming.
Rhonda Field. 247-2566

47-tfnc

PUPPIES TO GIVE AWAY.
...To a good home. 1500
Jackson or call 247 3501.

5-ltc

REAL ESTATE
FOR SALE....3 bedroom
house. 1 bath, ba semen!
Call 247 2226 after 5 p m.

48-tfnc

WANTED....I will do baby 
sitting in my home Daytime 
or evenings Connie Mick. 
1107 Virginia Call 247-2568 

5-tfnc

WANTED....Wheat and
stalk pasture for cattle. Call 
James Glaze. 272-4743 < r 
272 4208 51 -tfnc

WANTED....Home for one 
of our beautiful house 
plants Melrose’s Nursery. 
220 N 25 Mile Ave , 
Hereford. Texas. 3-tfnc

FOR SALE....5 bedroom
house to be moved Fully 
carpeted, draperies, storm 
doors, windows, lots built 
ins Located on F.uler farms. 
Priced to sell Hardy May. 
247 3865 3-tfnc

FOR SA1.E — Apartment
house, two bedroom. one

WANTED....Irrigated land 
to rent. Rickey Rector, 
phone 265 3420 2-tfnc

WANTED....Exterior paint 
tng Free estimate. Phone 
J A Loflin, 247-2573. 3-tfnc

TOO LATE TO 
CLASSIFY

I need someone to do 
housework and babysitting 
one or two days a week. 
Phone 247 3151. 5 tfnc

45 tfnc

MARSH AK M F I DF N
Representing 

Rushing Real Estate 
Phone 247 3907 
Res 247 3266 

Box 775, Friona. Texas

lot Well located I ^  baths, 
den, carpeted, fenced Call 
for appointment. 247 3053

5-tfnc
I

| ^The Lonely Heart

FOR SAIF..,.2 lots and 
storage house, cellat and 
orchard Call Harrell Mays, 
247-3477 48 tfnc

Would like to trade a small 
frame 2 bedroom house in 
grx>d condition with lot for a 
small house in Hereford 
Call 247 2210 3 2tc YOU MtAN Ukfe That ?

535348534853485348235353534823235353
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LEGAL NOTICE Contest Standings

LITTLE GOBLINS....The 11 a m. 
story hour enjoyed the Halloween 
season this week at Frtona Public 
Library by dressing up In costumes 
and masks. The Frlona Young 
Homemakers are In charge of the 
story hour.

■2arm m m //im /7 /7n7S 7S 77m 7m ?J/J»/M 77J7ff7J/777777m im <

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
The Commissioners' 

Court of Parmer County will 
receive bids until 11 A M., 
Nov. 10, 1975. for the
purchase of one new motor 
grader meeting the follow­
ing specifications:

Powered by 6 cylinder diesel 
engine with not less than 638 
cu. inch displacement, and 
not less than 135 horse­
power. 24 volt direct electric 
start, air cleaner with 
service indicator and auto­
matic dust ejector, muffler, 
accelerator - decelerator, 
power shift transmission, 
articulated frame, hydrau­
lic controls, tandem drive 
train differential with dif­
ferential lock-unlock, 14 foot 
hydraulic side shift blade 
with tip control, ROPS cab

with tinted glass, defroster 
fan, windshield washer and 
wiper (front), dome light, 
inside mounted mirror, 
adjustable control console, 4 
wheel oil disc brakes, 14 00 x 
24, 10 ply tires, heater, 
minimum weight 29,000 lbs., 
chromed moldboard

Parmer County will offer 
in trade:
One Used Caterpillar No. 12 
Motor Grader, Serial No. 
99E6875. with equipment.

The Commissioners’ 
Court of Parmer County 
reserves the right to accept 
or reject any or all bids.

By order of the Commis­
sioners’ Court of Parmer 
County.

James P Fortenberry 
County Judge 

4-?tc

121
Jack Clark 

120
Don Fortenberry 

119
Clay Handy, Bobby Drake, Mike 

Go wens
118

Fred Barker Jr., Edward Castillo, 
Movelda Fortenberry 

117
Dan Carthel 

111
Jackie Clark, W L. Cleveland, 

Wilson DiCuffa, Marie Fleming 
US

Mike Smith 
114
Jimmy 
Dianne

Kathy Cain, 
Jerry Hinkle, 
Jackie Morgan

Grlmsley,
Morgan,

113

LEGAL NOTICE
DEER HUNTER SPECIAL

★  1%S CHEW V» TOH PICKUP, AC 
m  POWER, OWRUMPSPRMS

★  1972 CAMPSITE CAMPER 9 
SLEEPS 4 ,4  JACKS FOR CAMPING

J J  S  M O B IL E  H O M E S , IH C .
P.O.BOX 412 

401 W HEEIiR AVENUE
a TEXIC0 NEW MEXICO 4I13S PHONE SOS 412 m i n

For all your personal, family and 
lusiness life insurance needs

call
B RON D HARDGROVE

BOX 749 1407 JAC*§ON 
FHlONA TIAA* 790)9

TCwC»mONC•CO 247 )49.

• Life Insurance • Health Insurance • Annuities 
• Group Insurance • Pension Plans

f s

T H E|  E Q U IT A B L E
Th« Equitable  Life A »»u r»nc * Society  o* th * United S t s t o  N * *  York, N V

NOTICE
SALE OF LANDS

The undersigned, having 
been appointed Receiver by 
the District Court of Parmer 
County. Texas, in Cause No. 
3620 upon the docket of said 
Court, by order dated 
September 18. 1975, and
being ordered to sell at 
public auction the herein­
after described lands, here­
by gives this public notice 
that, as such Receiver, the 
following lands, to-wit:

All of the North Half (N1̂ ) 
of Section 16, Harrah 
Subdivision, Parmer Coun­
ty, Texas, containing 160 
acres of land, more or less,

will be offered for sale at 
public bid at 10 30 A M, 
Tuesday. November 4, 1975, 
by the undersigned at the 
Courthouse door of Parmer 
County, in Farwell. Texas.

Terms shall be all cash, 
with 10 per cent deposit 
required by the successful 
and highest bid upon the 
date of sale The highest bid 
shall be subject to approval 
of the District Court of 
Parmer County, Texas, and 
the remainder of the cash 
bid shall be required to be 
paid at time of approval of 
sale by the Court and 
delivery of Receiver’s Deed.

Sale of the land shall be 
subject to all visible and 
recorded easements and 
such other matters as may

" a lw a y s  a  f r ie n d ly  
w e lc o m e "

Day-in to Day-out Savings  

at highest savings rates  

compounded daily...

•Mortgage Loans 

•Improvement Loans

be revealed by examination 
of the land An insured title 
shall be otherwise furnished 
to the purchaser with the 
Deed The purchaser shall 
be required to settle with the 
tenant for his plowing of the 
land at time of sale

J B. Sudderth, 
Receiver appointed in Cause 

No 3620, District Court, 
Parmer County. Texas.

806-481-3288
2-4fr

Leslie Broadhurst, Cindy Carthel, 
Marietta Carthel, Bobby W'led 

112
Patsy Randy, Jay Beene, Terry 

Brown, Joyce Broyles, Ron Cain, 
F.G. Crofford, Don Howard, Dale 
Milner

111
Donny Carthel, Owen Drake, Kay 

Dyess, Roy Smith 
110

Benny Pryor 
109

Fred Church, Donita Harkey, 
W.R. Mabry, Jim Noyes, Kay 
Nuttall, Janice Peak, Stan Powell, 
Carol Waldrop, Bobby Zetzsche

108
Dee King, Randy Mabry, Carolyn 

Murphree
107

Dale Cleveland, Ron Harkey, Lee 
Roy Nuttall, Dan Seright

106
Bill Bailey, B.K. Buske, Mary L. 

Collier, Ray D. Fleming, Lynda 
Grlmsley, Raymond Milner

105
R. L. Blakely, Raymond Hamilton, 

Celia Loflln, Maurlne Mabry, Jesus 
Mata, Don Maynard, Cindy Means, 
Michael Means, David Morales, 
Keith Pryor, John Seright

104
Eugene Bandy, Gene Exell, 

Eugene Ellis, Rickey Jackson, Eune 
Martin, Barbara McCoy, Gene 
Strickland, Kevin Wiseman, Pat 
Wright

103
Mrs. B.C. Hartwlck, Clint Mears, 

Itff Peak. Jimmy R. Walker
102

Charles Hamilton, Danny .Mur­
phree, Sarah Mears, Herb Seright, 
Jay Sturm, Alesia Tucker

101
S. D. Baize, Preach Collier, Ron 

Davenport, Sam Drager, Jan 
Fleming, Jerry Harrelson, Jaue- 
nene Lambert, Mai Manchee, Frank 
Truitt, Wright Williams

100
David Gowens, Buford Hartwlck, 

l.arry Johnston, Keith Martin, 
Clarence Monroe, Joy Morton, 
Clifford McLellan, Mary Priest, Ron 
Smiley

99
Fiddle Allen, Raymond Auburg, 

Wayne Mills, Alan Monroe, Jessie 
Morales, Sam Perez, Vickie Smiley, 
Max White

98
Tim Fllmore, Mollie Kirk, Koty 

Kothmann, Mary Pryor, Melba 
Smiley, Gladys Spring

97
Shirley Alvarez, Chris Barnett,

Matilde Castillo, Leroy Lambert, 
Donita Martin, Nancy Mingus, 
Peggy Monroe

96
Larry Martin, Mitchell Smiley, 

Toby Strickland, Larry White 
95 *

Charlie Bishop, Klpi Fleming, 
Mike Field, Jeff McCormick, Cindy 
Smiley, F..V. Thompson 

94
Johnny Alvarez, Philip Hand, 

Jimmy Lambert, David Phelps, 
Park Weatherly

93
Pam Dorris 

92
Todd Bandy, Doyle Mat 

90
David Mobley 

89
Joe Jackson 

88
Mrs. Richard And erson, 1..F. 

Jacobs, C.H. Veazey 
87

Wade Blake

K c ^ i d r i i t  1̂ 4 > w  Is

( hi W in n in g  T r t im
Velta Anderson of the Rhea 

Community bowled with a team 
from Clovis that captured first place 
in an invitational tournament at 
Albuquerque last weekend

The women bowled a series score 
of 2992. as all five bowlers had an 
over-500 series

Besides Mrs. Anderson, team 
members were Rosie Combs. Cheryl 
Winn, Rita Hitchcock and Sandy 
Durham

FRESH PRODUCE 

RUSSET

POTATOES
» *  8 5 *

20 OFF LABEL

FROZEN FOODS

BIRDSEYE

”  OKRA m  5 1 *
OCEAN PERCH

FILLETS »«
piMiroitvr i/. p ii

KEEBLER

COOKIES t r
FUPCE STRIPES DELUXE CRAHAMS

C R B C 0 ~ ~ ,
3 LB CAN 1

M u u a i  wa

IS .
ICECREAM H I

CHIPS

g u n n

44 WHITE'S SUPER MARKET
WE ACCEPT US0A FOOD STAMPS

OUR AIM IS TO PLEASE IN EVERY WAV

WE GIVE GUNN BROS. STAMPS W i DELIVER

DOUBLE STAMPS ON WEDNESDAY WITH PURCHASE OF '2 SO OR MORE PHONE 247 2250
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J V  Topples R iv e r  Road M  GWsits
Friona's Junior Varsity hosted the 

new Amarillo school, River Road, 
here Thursday night The Chieftain 
JV scored its sixth win of the season, 
but not without a hard fight, and by 
the narrow margin of 7-6

The Chieftains scored the third 
time they had the ball. River Road 
had a fourth and one from their own 
44 and elected to go for the first 
down But the stingy Friona defense 
held, and the JV had great field

P la n  M ow T Su p p o rt  

Y o u r U nited F u n d

ULYSSES
IRRIGATION RIPE CO.

A U.S. Industries Company
"And that makes a world of difference".

'Oil Hydraulic Drive 

•Electric Drive 

•Water Drive

position
Todd Bandy ran II yards for a first 

down to the River Road 21. Then 
Felder made seven yards and Mark 
Lunday IS for a first and goal. A 
penalty against the visitors moved 
the bail even closer to the goal-line.

Edward Castillo got the touch­
down from four yards out on the 
third play of the second quarter 
Castillo then kicked the all-impor­
tant PAT for a 7-0 lead.

Late in the third quarter, the 
visitors drove to the Friona one-yard 
line, having first and goal. Friona 
dug in, and recovered a fumble on 
third down to apparently stop the 
threat. However, three plays later 
Friona fumbled a pitchout and River 
Road recovered in the end zone for a 
TD.

Trying for the lead, the 
Amarilloans went for two points 
running but the Chieftains held, and 
managed to hold onto the slim lead

Friona had two other good 
chances to score In the fourth 
quarter, they had first and goal at

the six, and drove to the one, only to 
fumble

Late in the first half, a nifty pass 
play, Bandy to. Cliff McLellan 
worked for 24 yards, but McLellan 
was stopped on the one Only 15 
seconds was left on the clock, and in 
their haste to get the ball in, the 
Chief JV malfunctioned, and time 
ran out with the ball about a foot 
outside the end rone.

The freshmen, who had an open 
date, saw some action during the 
contest, particularly Kevin Koth- 
mann and Sandy Peters.

Statistics
Friona
11
142
49
191
M O

First Downs 
Net Yards Rushing 
Net Yards Passing 

Total Net Yards 
Penalties 

individual Rushing: Sammy Fel* 
der, 20-80; Mark Lunday 8-24; Todd 
Bandy, 14*21; Kevin Kothmann 8-10; 
Edward Castillo, 1*7.

H R .
8

II
29

120
9-73

H YG R0M AT IC :
I

LOCKW OOD

EASTHWV60 HEREFORD TEXAS 
PHONE 906-364-3501

N MWV19 CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO 
PHONE 505-762 7751

CHIEFTAIN FULLBACK Glenn 
London (32) is about to meet up with 
an Olton linebacker, whose team 
handed Friona a 29-1 loss.

CORNER CATCHER
The only center pivot in the world 

that hits the corners.
In a typical quarter section where a regular center pivot is 

irrigating 132 acres you can now do about 150 acres But 
the new Valley Corner System isn t limited to squares 
Irrigate both ends of a rectangle Irrigate odd shaped pieces 
of land too It s the answer to getting valuable productive 
land that s been wasted back under center pivot irrigation 

For flood irrigators, it s also the answer to automatic water 
and labor saving center pivot without wasting valuable 
acres No monitoring no labor problems no night work But 
you have all the advantages of precise irrigation and 
fertilizer application through the system that produces 
higher yields thdn ever before It s a simple concept precise 
in operation and engineered with quality of all Valley- 
built Center Pivots _

7®

PH0HE AC806 272-4266 \

1 9 7 6  C H IEFTAIN  Y E A R  B O O K S
GO ON SALE NOVEMBER 3 - 6

“ Looking Forward To The Past ”
*4.00 Deposit

S e llin g  a t A ll S chools
★  High School ★  Elementary

★  Junior High *  Grade School

WE W il l  ONLY ORDER AS MANY ANNUALS AS 
ARE SOLD NOW THERE W IU  BE NO EXTRAS 
ON SALE

BOTH SEMESTERS OF KINDERGA RTEN WIU. 
BE PICTURED IN THE 1976 CHIEFTAIN .

WE WISH TO THANK THE FOLLOWING BUSINESSES 
FOR THEIR SUPPORT IN ADVERTISING IN THE 

7 6  CHIEFTAIN

*

m

TOWNSPEOPLE WHO HAVE N
SCHOOL MA Y BUY AN ANNUAL BY STOPPING 
IN ATTHE HIGH SCHOOL.

GET YOURS IN ADVANCE!

Adams Drilling
Ag-Chem
Allen's Jewelry
Allsup’s 7-11
Anita's Snack Bar
Aztec Drive-Inn
Benger Aerial Spraying, Inc.
Benger Air Park
Big Nick’s (Bovina)
Big T Pump Company 
Bl-WIze Drug 
Bobby's Auto Coach 
Boeckman Construction 
Bovina Steakhouse 
Brockman Sales 
Brookfield Drilling 
Buddie's Electric 
Campbell’s Electric 
Carroll's 
Cattletown Inc.
Chalet 'c Bonte 
Mike Chaney 
City Body Shop 
Claborn’s Floral 
Cook Oil Co.
Crow's Meat
Cunningham's Electric Service

Connie Dodson Body Shop 
Don's Medicine Chest ( Bovina) 
Ethridge-Spring Agency 
Eva's Little House of Musk 
F allwell Floor 
Farmers Co-op Gin 
First State Bank of Bovina 
Foster's
F riona Cable vision 
F riona Consumers 
Friona Industries 
F riona Motors Company 
F riona Star 
Friona State Bank 
Friona Swirl A Curl 
F riona Wheat Growers 
Gatlin Land 
Gib's Cleaners 
(fibs on's
Herring Implement 
Hicks Plumbing A Heating

Ed Hicks Real Estate 
Holiday House Cafe 
Hop's Place Grocery (Hub)
Houser Food Market 
Hub Grain Company 
Johnnie Walters Music Studio 
Jones Motor and Supply 
Kendrick Oil Co. (Phllgas) 
l akeside Parts
Lewellen Bros. Spraying Service 
Lewellen Construction Company 
Malouf’s
Mama Seale’s Drive-In 
Missouri Beef Packers 
Mobile Wholesale Products 
Monsanto 
Nellie Jane’s Shoes 
Nobles TV & Appliance 
One A Only (Main Place)
Parmer Co. Auto Repair 
Parmer County Farm Bureau 
Parmer County Implement 
Parmer County Pump Company 
Parson's Ellis F uneral Home 
Perry's 
Plggly Wiggly
Plains Hardware and Furniture
Pmnvtpw f*rA/f• ss'Hrte* tfin

Reed's Cleaners
Reeve Chevrolet and Oldsmoblle 
Rhea Engine Grvif*
Rockwell Brothers A Co.
Roy's Tire Shop
Rushing Insurance Agency
Ruthle’s
Sherley Anderson Grain
Stowers Drilling A Buddies Cafe
Tasty Cream
Taylor A Sons
Terry’s Shop
Texaco(Shavor)
VW ay Chemical
Tri-County Savings A Loan
Walt's Printing
Webster's Upholstery
West F riona Grain A Tri-Co. Grain
Whites Auto
White's Grocery
Welch Auto Supply

m n m L i

m
& * jk

1

i
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Dimmitt To| JH 

Frosh, 21-0
Visiting Dimmitt scored in the 

first, second and third quarters to 
lake a 21-0 win over the Freshman 
Chieftains here Thursday, October 
23

Dimmitt scored the second time 
they had the ball, going 31 yards for 
a TD The point try failed, and the 
score was 6-0

Before the half ended, Dimmitt 
got back on the scoreboard on an 
80 yard run. Two points running 
were good with 45 seconds left in the 
half and Dimmitt led, 14-0

The visitors clicked again in the 
third quarter, on a 12-yard run, and 
this time kicked the point for a 21-0 
lead.

In the fourth quarter, Friona 
started to move when Kevin 
Kothmann passed to Cris Barnett for 
a 30 yard gain. But Dimmitt 
intercepted a pass a moment later to 
kill the drive.

The visitors added up 259 yards 
rushing Friona had 52 yards 
rushing and the same number 
passing

\

J L

TOUCHDOWN.... Edward Castillo 
(45) Is off and running as he scored 
the JV’s only touchdown in their 7-6

TIME TO CHUNK....Quarterback 
Keith Martin Is shown setting up to 
pass during the Abernathy game.

The Chiefs started too late and ran 
out of time as they were beaten 
14-10.

Chiefs, Bobcats 
Renew Rivalry

Things will be dufte a bit different 
from a year ago when Friona and 
Dimmitt tangle in a District 3-AA 
game at Dimmitt nex* Friday

Last year when the two met, 
Dimmitt had an 8-0 season record, 
and Friona was 6-1. The teams were 
fighting for a possible share of the 
district race.

The stakes will be different this 
year, but it's doubtful that the 
rivalry will be any less intense.

For one thing, the game will make 
the 40th renewal of the longtime 
series, which has been a heated 
rivalry, especially during the past 
dozen years or so.

Dimmitt, like Friona. has been in 
a rebuilding year. The Bobcats 
returned only seven lettermen off 
their 1974 team which finished with a 
9-1 mark and runnerup to Olton in 
District 3-AA This is the same as 
Friona returned.

Although the Castro County team

graduated super-star Robert May­
berry. who is starting for West 
Texas this fall, his younger brother. 
Thompson Mayberry is trying to 
follow in his footsteps, and as a 
sophomore, is one of the Bobcats' 
main barkfield threats.

In common opponents, Dimmitt 
lost to Muleshoe, 7-0, and to 
Littlefield, 31*10, but played tough 
Tulla close, 7-0, the week after the 
Hornets had blasted Friona, 27-0.

Although the Bobcats didn't have 
a single starter returning, both 
Mayberry and center Keith Gold­
smith saw considerable action. 
Mayberry played a lot against 
Friona after his older brother was 
hurt, an injury that caused him to 
miss the team's vital game against 
Olton

These two teams always try to do 
well against the other, so an all-out 
battle can be expected, even though 
the gold football won't necessarily 
be at stake.
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victory over River Road of 
Amarillo. Castillo also kicked the 
deciding point.

Chiefs Scrap , B ut
Olton Wins, 2 9 - 6

Friona played defending cham­
pion Olton close for three quarters, 
but went down to the Mustangs 
fourth-quarter flurry, 29-6. in the 
district opener for Friona last 
Friday night at Olton.

The Chieftains dominated the 
third quarter, and pulled to within 
seven points at 13-6 late in the 
quarter But Olton answered the 
challenge with two fourth-<)ua 
touchdowns, one with only 24 
seconds left in the game.

For the fifth week in a row. Friona 
went to the dressing room at 
halftime trailing by two touchdowns 
This time it was a 13-0 deficit. The 
score had been 14 0 for the previous 
four weeks.

Glenn Johnson, Olton's offensive 
star, turned out to be tough on 
defense as well. Johnson crashed in 
to block David Harnett's punt 
midway through the opening period, 
and Olton drove 35 yards In four 
plays.

Quarterback Jimmy Parker got 
the score by weaving his way 20 
yards A running try for points was 
filled by the Chiefs, and Olton led. 
6-0

Late in the quarter, Olton took 
over on their own 31 following a 
short Friona punt. Parker ran 28 
yards, passed for 13, and Johnson 
picked up 20 yards in two plays 
Johnson then got the TD from eight 
yards out, and a kick was good to 
give the Mustangs a 13 0 lead with 25 
seconds left in the opening quarter

Bobby Zetzsche made a good 
return on the kickoff, going to the 
Olton 43 before being downed from 
behind However, three plays gained 
only two yards, and the Chiefs had to 
punt on fourth down

Davy Carthel Intercepted an Olton 
pass 3:36 before halftime, and 
Friona drove from their own 45 to 
the Olton 16. Quarterback Keith 
Martin rambled 28 yards to the Olton 
17 with 49 seconds left on the clock.

Martin, who had a great night 
running the keeper play, almost 
went all the way However, on third 
down. Olton intercepted a Friona 
pass to end the threat For the game. 
Martin had 102 yards in 22 attempts

Olton coughed up the ball on a 
fumble on the third play of the 
second half, and Friona had it at the 
Mustang 45 Zetzsche gave Friona a 
first down at the Olton 33 The drive

Statistics

was stopped at Olton's 28
Ernest Mills put Friona in 

business five plays later, intercept­
ing a pass at the Friona 39 Mills 
made a great catch while diving 
along the ground

Martin gave Friona a first down 
near midfield, then plunged a yaid 
on first down to move the ball to 
Olton’s 40 A clutch fourth down pass 
to Carthel was good for 15 yurds to 
keep the drive going, and after Olton 
was penalized for a personal foul. 
Friona got on the scoreboard.

Zetzsche took the pitchout, headed 
to his right, and cut back, threading 
his way II yards Into the end zone. 
He went over standing up. Friona 
tried a similar play In an attempt to 
score two P 8Ts, but Zetzsche was 
stopped a foot short. The score 
became 13-6 with seven seconds left

in the third quarter.
Olton responded by driving 80 

yards. Johnson and Parker spui Kcd 
the drive Parker gained 52 yards in 
only four tries Johnson had gained 
27 yards, including the final ten He 
also ran for two points, and Olton 
stretched its lead to 21-6 with 8 Oti 
left in the game

For some reason. Olton tried an 
onsule kick that went out at Friona's 
45. and the Chief* were glad to have 
the hall at that spot Martin ran nine 
yards, and Carthel gave Friona u 
first down at the Olton 45

Martin ran seven yards for a first 
down at the Olton 32. and two plays 
later would have had another first 
down after a nifty nine-yard run to 
Olton's 20 But a bruising tackle 
separated him from the ball, and the 
Mustangs recovered It was the only

fumble loss of the night for Prior.i 
which had suffered a number 
costly fumbles in recent games 

Olton drove 76 yards to the Frlan 
ten. but Rolando Caballero got hi 
third pass interception and Friona 
fifth of the game to apparently h 
the threat.

But two plays later, with 3. 
seconds left. Olton got a pass 
interception The Mustangs wt 
quick to take advantage, a'. 
Johnson circled right end for 1 
yards and the TD with only 2 
se< onds left on the clock Parker i i 
for two PATs to wrap up the scorn >>

Friona Olton
II F irst Downs 20
190 Net Yards Rushing 311
18 Net Yards Pasting 42
208 Total Net Yards 353

1 Fumbles Lott 1
4-123 Puntt, Yardt 1-43
M l Punting Average 43.6
5-48 Penalties » I N

You re doing without a ’ im m i 
pivot Saving your hard n irn w  
tor othei improvements Don t 
borrow right now 
But it s costing you money eve 
wait Two ways Tirsl you re lc 
e itra  crop production you ge> 
irrigation Second inflation IS 
Boosting prices dropping the value 
of your dollars

Why not rent a Zimmatic unde* our new 
tease plan? Let the syxt 
and put some e itra  mon 
you at the same time

tic  c e n te r 
J c a p ita l 
want to

•> year you 
ismg the 
u n d e r 
at w o rk

i,
the bank for

Other above ground items in one 
fienibie package tailored lo your needs 
Why watt to irrigate'* It t  |USt costing yc 
money Call us today for details on 
our new lease plan

m m m

♦  4* ♦  +

SCORE BY QUA RTF RS 
Friona 6 6 6
Olton IS 6 6

INDIVIDUAL RUSHING
Player 
Keith Martin 
Glenn 1 ondon 
Bobby Zetzsche 
Kelwln King 
Fmest Mills 
Davy Carthel 

Totals

Tl B 
22 
13 
II 
2
1

2 
51

PASS RECEIVING
Player PC Yds Avg.
Davy Carthel 1 IS IS 0

Jeff Whiteside 1 3 3.6

NOTICE - WE ARE THE OLDEST ZIMMATIC DEALER IN THE 
PANHANDLE

WE ARE IN OUR 4N> YEAR SEUINC AND SERVICINC 
LINDSAYPRODUCTS

Adams Drilling Co., Inc.

i

FRIONA PHONE 247 2731

J
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ETHRIDGE-SPRING 
AGENCY, INC.

PAN ETHRIDGE 
CHARLES CAUPIU 
WENDEUGRESHAM 

10IS NORWOOD
N O N E  247 1766

OLTON AT LITTLEFIELD

FRIONA
WHEAT

GROWERS
D M S M U y .M It

SMI ATTFXAS A AM

t i PARMER 
COUNTY 

PUMP CO.
/

ARKANSAS AT RICE

13 WEST
FRIONA GRAIN

Don Huckabee Plione 247 3639

OKI A. ST. AT CO! OR ADO

1 PRODUCTION 
CREDIT 
ASSN.

WADE WRIGHT, MGR
FLOYDADA AT IDALOU

10

REEVECHEVROLET
-OLDS

CHEVROLET •OLDSMOBILE 
•FRIGIOARE APPLIANCES

Sales Service

12 HERRING 
IMPLEMENT CO

w ADAMS DRILLING
’ Hydro Pumps 
’ Zim m atic Sprinklers 
Well D rillin g  & Service 

‘ Pump & D rillhead Repair

Home Of The “Generation IT  TRACTORS

TEXAS TECH AT TCU

NX. ST. AT PFNN. ST
N.M. STATE AT W.T.

1 AG-CHEM FARM 
SERVICES

The one t r ip  machine
LOCKNEY AT ABERNATHY

4 FRIONA MOTORS
Parm er County Headquarters 

For
Ford Cars. Trucks. Pickups. 

T ractors & Used Cars 
Phone 247 2701

BOVINA AT VEGA

MIKE CHANEY 
FERTILIZER

i'i • /  • ' •

- V  BIGGER 
PROFITS1̂

NONE 29S 3444

P H I L L I P S  AT D A L H A R T

F l e m i n g  A S o n  G in  

H u b  G r a in  C o m p a n y  

F l e m i n g  F e r l i l i r e r

Pfione 265 321 5 o r 265 3405

PFRRYTON AT DUMAS

TRI-COUNTY
ELEVATOR

Block

Phone 265-3275

P A L O  D l  RO AT P A M P  A

CUSTOM r T c u ir n j  - I  i n r  i iH M ir r  n o r u

HI-PLAINS 
FEED YARDS

Earl Elam. M g r.

Phone m  JIINI

P O  Hox I2JA FRIONA. TEXAS

BAYLOR ATTEXAS

ENTER OUR CONTEST EACH WEEK 
. . .NOTHING TO BUY. . .JUST PICK WINNERS

H E R E ’S  Y O U R  C H A N C E  T O

W IN CASH PRIZES
FIRST PRIZE SECOND PRIZE THIRD PRIZE

** 1 0

GRAND PRIZES
1. TWO TICKETS TO THE COTTON 

BOWL GAME, PUIS >30 CASH.

2. TWO TICKETS TO THE SON 
6 0 W I GAME, P U IS ‘2 0  CASH.

3. *15 CASH

6 * 4
CONTEST RULES

1 P k k  the winner of the 20 Kim r« lifted in the advert isem ent*  
ihi this pa** " r i t e  the  winner* in the blanks provided on the 
official contest  blank
2 Ptrk the score of the tie b re ak e r  game th is  score will he 
used to break weekly as well as g rand p r i je  winners
t Hring vvur entrv blank bv the Friona S tar  or Hi W ile  Drug 
B\ i p m (in I ndav Entries  must be received in the  Star  office 
bv Vfondav to be eligible, il mailed
4. I he  leading contestant  at the  close ol 1.1 weeks will receive 
two free t ickets to the ( o t ton  Howl Football  game, along with 
i.lU expense  monev 'second place winner will receive two 
tickets to the Sun Howl gam*- and I 2 0 r « p r n * e  monev. th ird  
p lac*  winner gets SIS c a s h .

5. tPnlv one en trv  per perao'i.
ft lo  count for g rand  prires .  en tr ie s  mu«C be on official blank 
prin ted  in the paper
7. ( o n t r s t a n t *  must be 12 v ra rs  ol age or older.
H. F v e rv o n r  eligible to en te r  S p o n so rs  inc luded1 except 
empiovre* ol the  Friona S tar  and their families.

1 .  

2 .  

3
4 .

6 _

7
8 .

9
10

OFFICIAL ENTRY BLANK
s e l e c t  w in n e r s  f r o m  g a m e s  l is t e d  in  a d v e r t is m e n t s

______________________ 1 1 ______________________

12

13
14
4  IBB

16
17.
18
19
20

TIEBREAKER Pick
Score)

NAME
A0DRESS

FRIONA DMMffT

IS n c /i
NOBLES TV

AND

APPLIANCE
PHONE 247 3035

GEORGIA AT FI URMIA

PARMER COUNTY 
IMPLEMENT CO.

"  24 HOURS PARTS
SERVICE

Phone 247-2721

17 BENGER
AERO SPRAYING

★  DEFOLIATING * SPRAYING

* SEEDING *  DUSTING

5TT?V
PHONE 247 7861

NY JF.TS AT MIAMI

fg  Serving U In
6 n in  Cotton Ftrtiliztr Stid Chimicah

IN  THE HEART OF THE MAGIC TRIANGLE "

BRUEGEL BROS.
0 IN  &  ELEVATOR

ARMY ARMSTRONG MGR 

RES PHONE 247 3776 OFFICE PH 276 5295

HOUSTON AT RITISRURGII

”  LAKESIDE PARTS &  
MACHINE

★  COMPLETE AUTOMOTIVE PARTS 
*  TOOLS *  ACCESSORIES 

* MACHINE SHOP SERVICE 

ARLENMAV C H VEA2EV FRED FERGUSON 
PHONE 247 3195

r n  r  r v  i»

*NL»( VQv' Al MAT i »UT »f ST tor I t J I ”

D I S C O U N T  C E N T E R

W.HWV 60 FRIONA,TEXAS
STORE HOURS 9 A M TO 7:30 P M

CINCINNATI AT DFNVF H
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SCS Report
The Parmer County Soil 

and Water Conservation 
District held its regular 
meeting last week Leon 
Grissom, chairman, pre­
sided He welcomed M.C. 
Osborn, the newly elected 
director from Subdivision 
two, to the board of 
directors Grissom also 
expressed appreciation to 
Dick Rockey for his long and 
faithful service to the board.

Ralph Roming a farmer 
in the Bovina area met with 
the board and made a 
request for assistance

The SCS accomplishment 
report was made by Herb 
Evans, District Conserva­
tionist.

There were eight conser­
vation plans approved by 
the board.

The results of the annual 
inspection of works of 
improvement on Running 
Water Draw were noted No

action had to be taken as a 
result of the inspection,

George Davis, Area Con 
servationist. from Amarillo, 
was at the meeting and 
made a few brief comments.

The Parmer County Soil 
and Water Conservation 
District held an election in 
Subdivision two last week 
The election was for a 
director to represent the 
Subdivision on the District 
board McFarland C. Os 
born (M C. to his aggie 
friends) was elected He 
replaces Dick Rockey who 
has served in that position 
for over fifteen years

The board of directors 
meets monthly to continue 
to develop a strong Conser­
vation Program for Parmer 
County

The district, also, is a 
co-sponsor of the Running 
Water Draw Watershed 
Project. •

Kress Farmer Named 
K>Slt ( Imirm an

Kress farmer C.C. "Pap” 
Reed has been re-elected 
chairman of the Texas 
Grain Sorghum Producers 
Board for his second term

Board members named 
Larry Witten of Olton to a 
second term as vice chair 
man and elected John 
Gilbreath of Hart secre­
tary-treasurer to succeed 
Gerald McCathern of Here­
ford

The new officers were 
named at the regular 
bi-monthly TGSPB meeting 
during which four newly- 
elected directors were 
sworn In.

The four directors, all 
incumbents, were chosen by 
fellow grain sorghum pro­
ducers in the 29-county 
TGSPB area.

Named to their second 
six year terms are Ralph 
Mabry of Petersburg, who 
received 492 votes; K B 
Parish of Springlake, 474 
votes; C.P, Smith of Hale 
Center, 517 votes and Larry 
Witten of Olton, 485 votes 

Jerry Don Glover of 
Lazbuddie, the only other 
announced candidate, re­
ceived 441 votes.

Several ballots contained 
write-in candidates.

Mah on In Statement

Texans:
If you are tired of bigger government and higher taxes, 
vote NO on the proposed new constitution November 4.

Don’t give future Legislatures a blank check.

The Houston Chronicle calls the new constitution “ a 
dangerous document.” Governor Dolph Briscoe warns it will 
“ lead us down the road to a state income tax.”

Governor Briscoe says: “ It is my personal view that the 
current Constitution under which Texas has grown and 
prospered for a century is preferable to the proposed new 
constitution. Accordingly. I believe it is in the best 
interest of Texas that all eight propositions on the ballot 
be rejected

Play it safe. Keep our present Constitution by voting 
NO on Tuesday, Novem ber 4.

Paid political advertisement by CITIZENS TO PRESERVE THE TEXAS 
CONSTITUTION Senator Peyton McKmght. Tyler Chairman Mrs Pat Black 
Treasurer, 102 Vaughn Building Austin Te«as 78701

Congressman George Mahon, 
following the announcement by the 
Administration of a grain sales 
agreement with the Soviet Union, 
today said:

Although I have not had the 
opportunity to analyze all of the 
provisions of the announced agree­
ment, I am most pleased that the 
suspension of grain sales to the 
Soviet Union has been lifted 
However, the announcement of the 
grain agreement comes at a time 
when it appears that the Russians 
have already bought much of their 
requirements from sources outside 
the U.S. The benefits which will now 
accrue to the American farmer have 
been greatly diminished due to the 
long delays in lifting the morator 
ium."

Concerning the 5-year agreement 
for an annual purchase of 6 million 
tons of American grain by the Soviet 
Union, Mahon stated:

"I favor a long term grain sales 
agreement with the Soviet Union as 
long as the sales are made on the 
basis of the current market price at 
the time of the sale."

In commenting on the proposed 
purchase of Soviet oil by the United 
States, Mr. Mahon said:

"It appears that an agreement 
with respect to the annual purchase 
of 200.000 barrels of oil per day from 
the Soviet Union would be in the 
public interest. Of course, the 
amount being discussed is relatively 
small, but could prove significant as 
international trade agreements are 
considered during the 5-year 
period

rr> iT7irT7f>rrrirrrJ777rrT>r> f/f7r r r7S w r/7 7Jl

Is The Best Time To
F ertilize  Your Stalk  Ground

With The
“ONE ■ STEP MACHINE”

F O R  T H E  B E S T  R E S U L T S  IIS  
IIE -C O M P O S IIS G  S T A L K S . C A L L .

Ag-Chem Farm Supply
P H O N E  2 1 7 * 2 7 8 1  o r  C A L L  T H E  

“ S W A M P  B U G G Y  B A S E ”  O N  C B  C H A N N E L  1 3

R E D

RED  f\ I i; *  /  >1
H a l i l >

;M E A T S
SHURFRESH

>i BOLOGNA and 
FRANKS

1202
PKG 794

SHURFRESH

CANNED to ^  
HAMS , . * 8 ”  v !

/

* * \ x «
I __^  \

'OlMM, l u l l ! '

o

SHURFRESH

TURKEYS
-  6 9 *

SHURFRESH 
VAC SLICED PACK

B AC O N  ..* 1 ”
MANDARIN n <« 2
ORANGES cw  * fB
EARLY JUNE PEAS E J f £ 2
CATSUP 14 02. BOTTLE 1

FLOUR
SHURFWE

S LBS.

SPECIALS GOOD UNTIL NOVEMBER 8th

SNURFINE EVAPORATED

MILK
a  4 / $ | o o

SHURFWE

6 9
SHURFWE

COFFEE SALT
REG DRIP 

OR
ELEC PERC

SJ09
IODIZED or 

FREE 
RUNNING t o *

♦  *  * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *  *  tr * •

R fD
rV  V 1 E E E 3 2 Z I3 I  

lW j n r' ' l i  Dairy Products

BISCUITS BUTtERMIlK 9 /1
SUCED AMERICAN M

CHEESE FOOD 02 89*
NALFM00N LONGHORN

COLBY CHEESE
1002

79* i
VIKING HEAVY DUTY IS ■ 25

ALUMINUM FOIL
“ “ ""’ BLEACH 16AL
BOUNTY

TOWELS JUMeo
MED GRAIN RICE 2 18

IPANCAKE MIX
FANCY TOMATO JUICE

MACARONI A CHEESE

DINNER
WHOLE PEELED

TOMATOES “ a;c*» 
PORK &  BEANS
BEANS CUT GREEN 16 07 CAN

SPINACH ,!0,c"  
BUCKEYE PEAS IS 07 CAN

5 9
46 07

CRUNCHY w CREAMY . . .

PEANUT BUTTER »o> 2 f‘1 
CRANBERRY SAUCE t*o i 2 /7 6
SWEET PICKLES um ou/i 6 9

PEACHES " X ’ 2 / 6 9 9

CREAM STYLE tr WHOLE KERNEL

GOLDEN CORN &? 
FRUIT COCKTAIL» «
n u n t i i M

3/89<
3176

«# a * O l O A t

“ D - n r :
n U A L .IT Y

INCW 1 '  FROZEN F 0 0 C

CRINKLE POTATOES of 69*
SHURFWE PRECOOKED

FISH STICKS 3/*1 
ORANGE JUICE »oi S /f1
POTATOES russet 89
ONIONS VEUOW SWEET 2 IBS 39
RED DIUCIOUS

5 IBS *1°°
3 IB CAN

3/99

APPLES

CRISC0
COKES 3202.

BORDENS

ICECREAM ROUND CARTON 99
BARTLETT PEARS »«  2 /7 9 ’ | 
B U C K  PEPPER 4 9 ‘
ASPARAGUS SPEARS i\ 2 /7 9 (
CANNED DOG FOOD ”  «  7 / ‘1 
WAFFIE SYRUP » «  89*
SAITINC CRACKERS 16 07 
APRICOT HALVES 16 07 CAN 
RSP CHERRIES 1607 CAN 
CNNNK STYLE TUNA 6</i 07 CAN 
WHOLE SWEET POTATOES 16 07m

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

NOT DAR I  O DAILY
PARTY ICE POPCORN

ICE ES
DONUTS

BURRIT0S MONEY ORDERS
HOT LINKS g f  Stomp

/



r
r

PAGE 10. THE FRIONA STAR. SUNDAY, NOVEMBER 2. 1975

( l o u r !  H o u s e  N o te s
p*.

I
i
§

§

L
L

Instrument Report Ending
October 22, 1175 in County 
Clerk Office, Bonnie War­
ren, County Clerk

WD. City of Farwell. Kelly 
Green Seeds, Inc . alley way 
in Blk 94, Harwell 

Wl). B.L. Marshall. C.N
rrienen. NE *,4 Sec 3. and all 
W MU ac. of NW»/4 Sec 2. 
Blk l . S>nd

Wl), Warren Anderson, 
D.C Herring, Sec 33, 
T2N.R3E

Deed, Cloys Fancher, 
Jerry D Fancher, NW1̂  
and N»/,NW‘/4 Sec 21. 
l'5S.R4E

Deed, USA. Indalecio M 
Cruz, lot 8, Blk. 2, Hicks 
Add , Friona

WD, C W. Pennington. 
Farmers Home Adm., lot 2.

Blk. 2, Hicks Add , Friona 
WD, Billy Jones, Mac. 

Davis and Joe Stanton, tract 
out Garden lots 15 and 16. 
Sec. 31. T9S.R1E 

WD. Vina Hall, et al. 
James C Beaver. N 2-5th of 
lot 20 and alt lots 21 and 22, 
Blk 43. Farwell 

WD, Mickey Wilson. Dan 
Hoyt Smith, tract 30. Blk 1, 
Western Add , Friona 

Deed. USA, Amador San­
chez, lot 2, Blk. 5, Drake 
Rev. Sub . Friona 

WD. James D. Mabry, 
Lewis L. Smith, tract 24. 
Blk. 1, Western Add , 
Friona

MARRIAGE LICENSES
Albert Steward. Jr. and 

Vicki Jan Cannon.

■

4W  T H E  F A R M  
I  n P a r m e r  C ou n t v

>1 \ (  K IIKAI.il C ounty Agent
TWO SOIL CHEMISTS and two agronomists will be 
featured speakers for a fertilizer shortcourse at the 
County Exposition Building in Dimmitt beginning at 7 30 
p.m. on November 6

The one-evening event is of special interest to area 
producers needing a refresher course on plant nutrients, 
forage and grain fertilization and soil testing 

Dr Charles D Welch, head of the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service Soil Testing Laboratory at College 
Station and Jim Valentine, head of the Extension Soil 
Testing Laboratory at Lubbock, will discuss fertilizing 
corn and sorghum and the value of soil testing 

Dr. James Supak, Extension agronomist-cotton, will 
• take a practical look at plant nutrient carriers, and Dr. 

Frank Petr, F xtension area agronomist at Amarillo, will 
discuss fertilizing small grain.

Sponsored by the Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service and the Panhandle Economic Program for 
Castro. Deaf Smith and Parmer counties, the fertilizer
•shortcourse is designed to aid area producers in planning 
their fertilizer programs

Topics to be discussed will be short and to the point 
Included will be factual information on fertilizer use 
practices that have been proven effective in our area.

Refreshments will be provided No fee will be 
charged for the shortcourse

WELL PARMER COUNTY FARMERS, you ve done it 
again* Statistics released from the USDA and Texas 
Dt partm. nt of Agriculture on the 1974 cash receipts from 
tin* sale of farm commodities show that Parmer County 
grossed $158,205,000 This ranked Parmer County third in 
the state in 1974 with Hidalgo being first with $201,993,000 
.ind Deaf Smith second with $160,690 000 Parmer County 
ranked second in crops behind Hidalgo with $93,052,000 00 
being received

In livestock sales Parmer County ranked fourth with 
$65,153.000 00 Parmer County's number one ranking in 
corn and number two ranking in fed cattle helped push 
the overall gross income to number three in the state In 
a later issue of this paper I’ll have the 1975 projection 
thut was recently figured

and widespread 
, if the current

REMEMBER 1 HE HIGH sugar pric 
hoarding just a s h o r t  year ago W< 
outlook for sugar production in the United States 
re>! of the world is accurate, sugar supplies will be 
plentiful during the coming year So. consumers may see 
.i slight softening in retail prices 

U S production of both sugar cane and sugar beets 
should be up sharply this year compared to 1974 The U S 
I>epurtment of Agriculture has estimated sugar cane out 
put will he up about 14 per cent while production from 
sugar beets may be up 25 per cent from levels a year ago 

t unibmed U.S. production of sugar cane and sugar 
beets should total In the neighborhood of SG million tons 
while the world sugar crop may exceed IS million 
tons- up four to tlx million tons from a year ago

The

re samr time that piroduction is expa nding. pe
consumption of refinu>d sugar in tlie U S is dow:
American may consuime less tha n 90 pounds c
1 sugar this year, the lowest artlount since th
4hur t years of W<»rld War II
decline in sugar use is mainly dijf (o Consume
nee to high prices of sugar and sugar-containin

Also, a new htghfructose 
available in larger quantities i

up is 
petingj becoming

(with the sugar market
The decreasing consumption of sugar Is not unique to 

ihe l S. alone Demand is also expected to be down In 
Europe, Jupan and Canada.

What effect will the larger sugar crop have on prices'* 
Pn« es for raw sugar in the U S may drop as low as $17 
•r hundred pounds this fall, after rising above the $23 
vel at mid August
This means that consumers may see a little relief at 

it* supei market But for those hoping for sugar at the

the
base
ards

it price of several y< 's ago, it s just

REE REMOVAL OE
DUD STOCK

m ts.

WBM TOC IMtfl KAO STOCK.
w n rcss ft coir

ro t  F in  REMOVAL CALL IS

TRI-STATE INDUSTRIES, Ik .
Am a HIo ft WE PtubvUw

;%~«4jf

F D I A I I A  T C V A 0  STORE HOURS 9 AM TO 7:30 PM
f l U v i l M ,  1 (D C^IA IR AAAfl HAW 2 TUCHISPECIALS GOOD NOV 3 THRU NOV S

YOO ll •( Oly,%

POLAROID
108

COLOR PAK
RIM I 399

CM0 
MOTOR 
OIL
30 WT NON DETERGENT

f OR THESE

29t

COUCH CRM*

MACARONI AND 
CHEESE

4 For
GLASS PLUS
ML PURPOSE CLEANER 

NATH EASY SPRAYER

6 9 *

a

K

DETERGENT
JUMBO 

9  IB . 13 0Z .

CASCADE
MSMMSHINC

KTEMCKt 7 0 4
(giant S i z e  f  ^

TRAPPERS JAIAPEN0
BARBECUE BEANS
NO. 300  C M  A

' ^ l

PINE POWER
DtSENFECTANT 

CLEANER BY TEXDE
IS 0Z BOTTLE

59*
MR. 6000

PEANUT
BUTTER
REG >1W

i |5 7
lASGf J l i S O Z

SUPER
P O L I - G R I P

EXTRA HOiDtUG fOHMUlA

SUPER P0U-GRIP
LARGE SIZE

REG. 10 7 1*/t 0Z. 79«

Daisy by G ille tte
The? First Twin Bladed Disposable Shaver 
Designed Especially For Women.

SPECIAL OFFER
worth of Gillette 

a  in store coupons
9y
i r 7

in this special package

C REM E RINSE
& C O N D ITIO N ER

BAYER

CHILDREN'S 
ASPIRIN
J t’S *6 6  46 274

&SAVE 95cj*• - • •• •

Reg $1 19

? Skivers in 
» ,k4s par k age

5j5 }  Recessed blades lor safety
5*5 Curved handle for better 

visibility
Non slip gups 

S*t Proti'Ctive safety cap
5̂* Each shaver gives weeks and 

weeks of safe, close shaves

F R E E  daisy
SHAVER
with each 8oz.
purchase 9 3

VASEUNE DEC 153
HERBAL BODY SMASH «oz

4

89 ♦

GIBSON STEEL BELTED RADIAtS
WEAR OUT P0UCEY 40,000 M lliS  OR 

4 0  MONTHS

SAVINGS OF *28 .00  PER SET

Serqeants
sfimrr rv cou an...it • -a*« ■»

SERGEANTS
SENTRYIY

CAT AND DOC 
FLEA COUARS 
REG $939
11 1 1  I  ^

ML

SHEETS AND 
PILLOWCASES
V i O ff REG PRICE

ONE GROUP
BATH TOWELS
4 ASST COLORS

SIZE REPUCES FET REC PRICE SALE PRICE
GR 7 1 1 14 4 2 5 114 2 8 9 45 66 38 66
HR 7 8 1 14 IS S *M 3 0 9 48 88 4188
6R 78 *15 8 2 5 1 15 2 9 6 45 88 38 88
HR 7 1 1 IS 8 5 5 1 15 317 48 88 4188
L R 7 ti1 S 91S i  IS 3 4 6 52 88 45 88

HMMNfcl

HAIR SPRAY
REG 1 5 7  

I 0 Z
f

YASEUNE

PETROLEUM
JELLY

7 * / i t e

SALE PRICE INCLUDES U0N  THE SPOT1 
MOUNTING AND BALANCING

J ERGEN’S

DIRECT AID 
HAND LOTION

REG 1 4 7  
M 0 Z

Drecl
Aid

I

T R A C  IT  9  s

4 ] 59

k

/
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DR. ARMSTRONG

i

ENMU Announces New President
I he new president of Eastern New 

Mexico University is Dr. Warren B, 
Armstrong, dean of the College of 
Liberal Arts and Sciences at St. 
Cloud State University of St. Cloud, 
Minnesota.

Dr. Armstrong was introduced at 
a Saturday press conference on the 
ENMU campus by Board of Regent 
Chairman W B McAlister The new 
president succeeds Dr. Charles W, 
Meister who resigned in February of 
1975. Dr. Gail Shannon, academic 
vice president, has served as acting 
president since that time.

McAlister stated that the regents 
had chosen a professional with 
excellent qualifications In all areas 
of university administration. “ Dr. 
Armstrong obtains all of the
necessary assets we feel It takes to 
make an excellent president for 
Eastern." he added. He assumes the 
presidency December 1.

Dr Armstrong, 42, received a PhD 
in history in 1964 from the University 
of Michigan and a master's degree 
in history in 1958, also at the 
University of Michigan.

In discussing the presidency, Dr. 
Armstrong explained “ I look 
forward to my association with 
Eastern New Mexico University as 
it is the type of institution in which I 
have had my most extensive 
experience, productive service, and 
in which I believe I will be a 
successful president.

a ue-' -  .....  mu ---- ---------

★ ★ ★ ★ ★

DR. WARREN ARMSTRONG

“ 1 consider the fostering of a 
climate of mutual trust and respect 
within the campus community, and 
between the campus community and 
the larger society, to be a primary 
responsibility of the president. I 
believe that an open and democratic 
approach to institutional gover-

Gospel Meeting
Lazbuddie Church Of Christ 

FEATURING Parker Henderson,
Speaker

Missionary M inister To Thailand

NOVEMBER 2  To 5
T I M E S : Sunday 1 0 :3 0  A .M .&  6 :0 0  P.M. 

Monday T h n  Wednesday 7 :00  P.M.

nance is essential in meeting this 
responsibility, and this has always 
been my first commitment in 
academic administration."

At St. Cloud, he has served as dean 
and history professor since 1171. He 
has been Involved In several 
administrative committees Includ­
ing Academic Affairs, the Presi­
dent’s Cabinet, and the Faculty-Stu- 
dent- Administration Council. He 
was also a member of the 
Presidential Task Force on goals 
and objectives of St. Cloud State.

Dr. Armstrong was in several 
academic ranks at the University of 
Wisconsin at Whitewater from 1965 
to 1970. He was assistant, associate 
and full professor during 1965-1969; 
assistant dean of the College of Arts 
and Sciences from 1966-1969. and 
associate dean in 1969-1970

Prior to his appointment at 
Whitewater, he was chairman of the 
history department at Olivet College 
in Michigan from 1964-1965. He 
joined Olivet as a history instructor 
in 1961 and was named assistant 
professor in 1962 and associate 
professor in 1964.

He appears In several honor 
publications Including the “ Direc­
tory of American Scholars,” “ Who's 
Who In the Midwest,” and “ Who’s 
Who In America." He has 
participated In 14 television pro­
grams conducted by the “Tlme- 
-Llfe" educational series, published 
educational articles, assisted In the 
publication “The Prison: Voices
From the Inside,” and presented 
book reviews and papers at several 
professional meetings.

His wife, Joan, is a certified 
elementary instructor and is 
presently a curriculum consultant 
with the St. Cloud Public Schools

Tern pe rat u rrs

DATE HI-LOW

SATURDAY. OCT. 25 
SUNDAY, OCT. 26 
MONDAY. OCT. 27 
TUESDAY, OCT, 28 
WEDNESDAY.OCT. 29 63 - 33 
THURSDAY. OCT. 30 67 - 34
FRIDAY. OCT. 31 74-41

• 4 — P  —•

C o n g r a t u la t io n s
....................... Ullllll m u ,,..
to ERNEST OSBORN

FOR BRINGING IN  OUR FIRST BALE 
OF COTTON FOR THIS SEASON

WE ARE READY TO SERVE YOU!

FRIONA FARMERS 
CO-OP GIN

PHONE2 4 7 -3 1 8 5
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FEEDLOT MANURE 
IS BETTER

Composted Feedlot Manure From Our Stockpiles Offers These 
Advantages Over Freshly Scraped Manure.

★  One Sty Ctonr To AnibbiUy Of Plant Nutrient*

★  Wuxi Seed Problem* An SubrtunHaly Reduced Wbtn Msaars h
StoetyUd M  Mound To Comport Boforo 8ppt o * w

★  Comported Manure I* More Granular And Spread* More Uniftrmif

Than FrertUf Scraped Manure.
★  Uwnr Moisten Content Malm Comported Manart A Bettor Buryrt*

Than Freshly Scraped Manure.

HOW MUCH IS COMPOSTED MANURE WORTH ?
10 Tons Of Composted Feedlot Manure Per Acre Will Yield Approuimatily

320 UNITS OF NITROGEN (AT 16% N)
300 UNITS OF PHOSPHORUS P 0 ‘ (AT 1.5% P*0$)

340 UNITS OF POTASSIUM IPO (AT 17% IPO)

Total Value In 10 Tons Of Composted Manure At Estimated Commercial
Fertilizer Cost

320 UNITS OF N AT' 119 PER UNIT ‘31 OS 
300 UNITS OF P*05 AT1105 PER UNIT ‘51.50 
340 UNITS OF IPO AT ' 05 PER UNIT ‘17.00

113.58
# Dees Not Include Application Cost Of Commercial ForUfaer

Estimated Availability Of Units In One 10 Ton Application Of Compost
1st Year 2nd Year 3rd Year

N 144 71 38
P*0S 135 66 36
W  340

Estimated Value Per Year O f One 10 Ton Application Of Compost

1st Year 2nd Year 3rd Year
N 17.14 *8.45 ‘4.52
P W  *26.32 1 2 8 7 ‘7.02
K*0 17.00 —

6 0 4 6 21.32 ‘11.54
Manure Supplies Other Secondary And Micro Nutrients (Such As 

Calcium And Magnesium) And Has Beneficial Effects Beyond It's 
Ability To Supply Nitrogen, Phosphorus, And Potassium. Continued 

Applications Of 10 To 15 Tons Per Acre Can Be Expected To Nave 
Favorable Effects On Soil Physical Properties, Such As Increased 
Water Intake, Increased Water Holding Capacity And Improved 
Structure.

A I I A  F P P A I A t  a l l i l i B A P  l i f t *
4 * %  m  m *  A I 1 ! !  • | « 4 P | A »  « 1

BEEN STOCKPILED AND 
AUOWED TO COMPOST

F R IO N A  FEED V A R D S
FOR PRICES C A U  LEE BRITTING < 0 6  265-3574

J

/
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Recipes
Partner County cooks are Invited 

to submit their favorite recipes for 
publication In the winter Issue of 
TDA Quarterly, a Texas Depart­
ment of Agriculture consumer- 
oriented magazine.

Recipes unique to the Plains area 
and old-time specialities will be 
stressed However, any good recipe 
will be considered, Agriculture 
Commissioner John C White said 

Since cattle are important to the 
Plains area, a speical look out will 
be kept for beef recipes.

In addition to recipes, old-time 
methods of food preservation in 
danger of disappearing will be 
printed Anyone with tips from the 
past on preserving foods is invited to 
send them in, White said 

Deadline for submitting recipes 
and hints from the past will be 
November 21 ,

TDA Quarterly takes a look at a 
specific region of Texas in each 
issue. It began publication this ye&r 

Recipes and tips selected for 
publication will be credited to the 
sender. They will not be returned. 
They should be mailed to the Texas 
Department of Agriculture, Infor­
mation Section, P.O. Box 12847, 
Austin, Texas 78711.

JAM S MOWFRY and DAVID SANDERS... M r and Mrs. Glenn Mowery of
Carlsbad. New Mexico, announce the engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter, Janls, to David Sanders, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
J.D. Sanders of Seymour, Texas. They are both students at Wayland Baptist 
College In Plalnview. Wedding vows will be exchanged at the First Baptist 
Church of Carlsbad on Saturday, January 3. The Sanders are former Friona 
residents.

S t .  T eresa s l las

DORM PARENTS....Sharon and 
Mike Mills (at left) enjoy a visit with 
a couple of Oklahoma Hall residents. 
Paula Hawkins (third from left), 
Duncan, and Karen Fisher, Okla­
homa City. Mr. and Mrs. Mills are

resident hall supervisors and
campus parents to 330 coeds living in 
Oklahoma Hall, Southwestern State 
University's largest womei’s dor­
mitory.

Former Friona Residents
ire Parents

a big

n the 
Mills 
been

If ever a couple was ideally suit 
to be dorm parents, it would be Mi 
and Sharon Mills, resident sup< 
visors of Oklahoma Hall 
Southwestern State University 
Wearherford. Oklahoma 

The young husband and wife t 
responsible for the well-being of ! 
fun-loving coeds And that' 
responsibility 

With every room occupiet 
largest dormitory on campu 
surprisingly reports “ It hasi 
any problem so far. it's been a lot of 
fun."

The Mills took over their position 
last June, and they seem to have 
adjusted quite well Proof of the 
rapport they have obviously 
established comes from the dormi 
tory residents themselves, who have 
only favorable comments about 
their “mom and dad."

Mrs Mills received her bachelor 
of science in education degree from 
Southwestern last May. majoring in 
elementary education, and is 
presently working toward her Early 
Childhood Certificate 

Mills is m his third professional 
year of Pharmacy School and

n parent life She adds “ I 
>ppor»umty to meet new 
1 make new friends ’*

Regular Meeting
St Teresa's Ladies Society met in 

the Parish Hall Tuesday. October 28 
after the evening mass.

Angelia Bermea opened the 
meeting with a prayer. Mary Lou 
Venhaus gave a report on the 
sausage dinner Olivia Ortiz gave 
the parish council report.

Angelia Bermea and Nato Saldana 
are to set a date for a joint meeting 
of St Teresa's Ladies Society and St. 
Teresa's Mens Society to plan a 
building schedule for the future

Sylvia Roth gave a report on the 
CCD program, also the names of our 
golden age citizens having birthdays 
and anniversarys during the month 
of November.

Cleaners for the month of 
November are Irene Bermea and 
Felix Crutchfield

Hostesses for the November 
meeting will be Dorothy Blanken­
ship and Susie Perez.

Refreshments were served to 
Mary Lou Venhaus. Olivia Ortiz. 
Sylvia Roth. Toni Castillo, Hortencia 
Bermea. Evelyn Ball, Matilda 
Caballero. Dorothy Blankenship and 
Helen Fangman by Angelia Bermea 
and Irene Bermea

Judge Fortenberry
Rhea H Speaker

p irmer
enben
ting

County Judge Paul 
was guest speaker at a 

f the Rhea Home 
Demonstration Club Monday night 
at the Rhea Lutheran Church

Judge Fortenberry spoke on the 
proposed constitution on which 
Texas voters will express an opinion 
at the polls Tu sday. He presented 
both sides of the issue and urged 
those attending to vote in the 
election,

Husbands of club members and 
Mrs Fortenberry were special 
guests

Attending were Mr and Mrs 
Herbert Schueler, Mrs Norman 
Taylor Mrs Elmo Dean, Mrs 
Shirley Smith, Mr and Mrs Norbert 
Schueler, Mr and 
Drager. Mrs Raymor

Mr
Dri

Chrii 
r, Mr

expect s tog[raduat e next iipring with and VIrs Raymond Schueler, Mr
a bachelor of seif>ncip in pharmacy and Mrs \A a Iter Schlueler . Mr and
degree Mrs ('arl Schlenker . Mr and Mrs

Both are |gradua tes of Friona High Floyd Schllenker. Mrs Lai•ry Potts.
School His pare nts. Mr and Mrs Mrs Jay Potts. Mrs Melinda
Wayne MillIs, still tide m Fr Iona. Schl< ker, Herman Schue ler. Mrs
while her parent: Mr j plj Mrs Cordlie Pol ts. Mr ar d Mrs Leland
FG Cirofford. reoent ly moved from Gusi in and1 Mrs Houston Bartlett
Friona to 

“ It’s a 
while exo«

Texas
-lifetimi 
M r |

>rth
Mi

the program, the group met 
sh Hall of the church for 
ments of Halloween cookies.
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hot tea and coffee served by Mrs 
Melinda Schlenker and Mrs Dean.

Next meeting of the club will be a 
Parmer County THDA luncheon at 
Clara's Restaurant In Farwell 
Thursday, Nov. 20. The Oklahoma 
Lane HD Club will serve as 
hostesses for the luncheon.

Mrs. Glen Reeve Sr of Friona will 
present her well-known “ Brides of 
the White House" doll program.

Briefly discussed at the Monday 
night meeting was the bake sale the 
Rhea HD Club will sponsor in the 
Christmas Bazaar set Nov 14-15 at 
the County Show Barn in Friona 
LOCAL AGENT TO ATTEND 
NATIONAL MEETING

Miss Jana Pronger. Parmer 
County Extension Agent-home 
economics, will attend the 41st 
Annual Meeting of the National 
Association of Extension Home 
Economists October 27-31 in 
Knoxville. Tenn,

“Spirit of '76 ": Spotlight on
Professionalism" is this year's 
theme, and meeting goals include 
'perceiving our heritage, promoting 

professional excellence and pursu­
ing professional accountability," the 
agent said

Dr Virginia Y Trotter, assistant 
secretary for education--in the U S. 
Department of Health. Education 
and Welfare-will be keynote 
speaker, and Edwin L Kirby, 
administrator. Federal Extension
Vrvir* <?****« rionnrtment

at the Recognition Ceremony, 
October 30

Other highlight* include the 
presentation of the Distinguished 
Service Award to six Texas county 
Extension Agents. along with 
election of officers and a “Spirit of 
'76 Dinner." hosted by the southern 
region Extension home economists 
and coordinated by Mrs Shirley 
Neel, Nacogdoches County Exten­
sion Agent and southern region 
director

Texas Distinguished Service Aw 
ard winners include Mrs Shirley 
Gray Dodd of Port Lavaca. Jetti L 
Coleman of Wharton. Mrs Ina Lee 
Holt of Navasota. Mrs Irene V 
Johnson of Lufkin. Mrs Barbara J 
Martin of Victoria, and Mrs Lula M 
Pittman Spears of Angelton
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MR. AND MRS. E.S. WHITE SR.....A Fiftieth Wedding Anniversary
reception will honor Mr. and Mrs. Edward Samuel White Sr. Sunday, 
November 9 from 2 to 4 p.m. in the Community Room of Frlona State Bank. 
The couple's nine children will host the occasion. Their children are: Mr. 
and Mrs. E.S. White Jr. of Frlona, Mr. and Mrs. R.L. (Ann) Campbell of El 
Paso, Mr. and Mrs. R.R. (Mae) Holder of Ft. Worth, Mr. and Mrs. V.H. 
(Irene) Roberts of Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. John (June) Cannon of Dumas, 
Mr. and Mrs. R.C. White of Stratford, Mr. and Mrs. W.C. (Sue) Hinds of 
Canyon, Mrs. Lois Milligan, also of Ft. W orth and Richard W hlte of W illard, 
New Mexico. Edward Samuel White Sr. and Esther Fern Hamm were united 
in marriage on November 8, 1925 at Bovina, Texas, by Rev. I.E. Walker.

Program
Highlights

Meeting
The Progressive Study Club met 

at 8 p.m. on Saturday, October 25 at 
the Federated Club House for a 
Halloween Costume Party. Special 
guests were children of club 
members and Linda Warren.

Members answered rcll Cali with a 
Trick or Treat safety tip "The 
Great Pumpkin Is Coming"’ was 
presented by Maxine Loafman. 
Martha Garner was welcomed as a 
new member.

Members and guests joined in a 
costume parade accompanied on the 
piano by l.unell Horton. Prizes were 
given for the following costumes: 
funniest-Jessica Maurer; most 
original-Sunny Horton; scariest- 
Mark Mabry; best dressed mother- 
Ann Osborn.

Everyone then participated in an 
hour of Halloween fun and games 
including a spook house, fishing, 
orange relay, fortune telling, balloon 
relay and bobbing for apples.

Refreshments of popcorn balls, 
candy corn and witches brew were 
served by Maxine Loafman and 
l.unell Horton. Mary Bavousett, 
Mary Echols and Jeannette Maurer 
were in charge of the games.

Church To 
Pt *esent Film

From out of the Book of Luke, 
paraphrasing the story of Lazarus 
and the Rich Man. comes one of the 
screens greatest stories. "The 
Burning Hell" opening at the 
Templo Bautista at 403 Woodland in 
Friona, November 2 at 7:30 p m.

‘The Burning Hell" which stars a 
host of Christian performers and 
hosted by Evangelist Estus Pirkle is 
probably the first motion picture in 
the history of films to attempt 
documenting the miseries and 
torments of a literal burning hell.

Hollywood know-how is credited 
for much of the realism in this film 
made by the Nashville based 
Ormond Organization. Ron Ormond 
who spearheads the company spent 
most of his life in the Hollywood 
studios as both producer and 
director until he and his family were 
saved and moved south to 
Tennessee.

“One of the greatest things about 
this film," Evangelist Pirkle added, 
"was how it effected so many lives. 
People were saved even while the 
picture was being made."

"Some of the outstanding ‘special 
effects’ and scenes in ‘The Burning 
Hell’ are just unbelievably real."

The cast includes hundreds and is 
honored by the guest appearances of 
these internationally known preach­
ers- Doctors R.G. Lee. Jack Hyles 
and Bob Gray.

OEA OFFICERS INSTALLED..New 
officers of the South Plains College 
Chapter of the Office Education 
Association (OEA) were recently 
Installed In ceremonies at the 
Levelland campus. From left are 
Terri Howard of Whltharral, state 
OF.A secretary; Barbara Nance of 
Sundown, historian; Jan Payne of 
Lubbock, reporter; Gayla Self of 
Friona, parliamentarian; Karen

Awbrey of Sundown, president; 
Ronda Hall of Littlefield, vice 
president; Karla Smart of Farwell, 
secretary; and Christina Sanchez of 
Lubbock, treasurer. Installing offi­
cers were Gall Albus of Pep, past 
president of OF'A, and Teresa 
Caswell of Levelland, past state 
OEA parliamentarian. Miss Self is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Max 
Self of Friona.

These Sponsors Welcome You To Friona*s Churches

Etli rid jje-Spring

First iia|)list CJiuivli
Friona State Hank

Frimin ( .oilsiimers
No l»le*’ T \ & Apple

R C A - X L I 00

Hilulling Insurance

1’Yinmi Motors
a

' Wouldn't you know it —  right when 
collections are o ff!"

Anthony's
Sugar land Mall and Downtown Hereford

FIRST BAPTIST
SIXTH AND SUMMITT- REV. BILL PKNI AND

CALVARY BAPTIST
141II AND Cl F VF I AND REV. RON TRUSLF R

/ -  • *  « - i  »>  •

LUTHERAN CHURCHES 
FRION V I MTKD METHODIST 

( i n  m u
8TH AND Pll KCF BOBBY McMIl I AN

CMOS CONGREGATION\l.

Bovina Principal To Direct Spelling
Jim Noyes, principal of 

Bovina Junior High School, 
has been named to direct the 
activities for the It7l 
Parmer County Spelling 
Bee, to be held in
conjunction with the 28th 
annual competition, co­
sponsored by the Amarillo 
Globe-News and West Texas 
State University.

April 24 will be the date
for the regional eliminations 
in Amarillo and the location 
will be the Stephen F Austin 
Junior High School 

There will be 46 counties 
represented

The area assigned the 
Amarillo Globe-News and 
West Texas State University 
covers 29 counties in the 
Texas Panhandle, 10 in 
Oklahoma, four in New 
Mexico and three in Kansas 

All students in the public 
and parochial schools are 
eligible to participate Any

student who will not have 
reached his (or her) 16th 
birthday or gone beyond the 
eighth grade at the end of 
the current school term, will 
be eligible to enter any 
school contest and partici­
pate in the county elimina 
lions.

All details of the county's 
Bees will be available from
the director.

County directors have 
complete control over their 
contests and may conduct 
the spelldowns either ver­
bally or orally The Amaril­
lo regional contest will be 
oral competition

Most schools use the 
booklet prepared by the 
national sponsors, "Words 
of the Champions " The 1976 
issue may be obtained by 
writing:

Spelling Bee Director
Amariln Globe News 

Box 2091
Amarillo, Texas 79166

The price of the book is 25
cents.

The champions from 
Parmer County in 1975 
were:

Senior Division: Michael 
Boling, a student In the 
Farwell Junior High School; 
and Junior Dlvlson: Pam 
Perez, a student in the 
Frlona Junior High School.

An all-expense paid trip to 
national competition -to be 
held in Washington, DC. 
early in June-will be

Mr. and Mrs Kenneth 
Ford are the parents of a 
baby girl born Tuesday, 
October 21 at Deaf Smith 
General Hospital in Here­
ford

She weighed seven 
pounds, seven ounces and 
was twenty and one-half 
inches long at birth She was 
named Lee Ann.

awarded the region 
champion when he is natm 
next April. .

Gehe Parker,’director 
placement at West lex. 
State University, is b« 
coordinator Spelling B> 
Editor is Mrs. Jean 
^artlett, Amarillti Glob< 
News.„t

Interested students, t< 
achers and school official 
may" contact the Aniurili 
Globe-News for addition, 
information

Lee Ann has an oldt 
sister, Stephanie, sevr 
years old.

Grandparents are Mi an 
Mrs Olin Burchett of Frion 
and Mr and Mrs W H For 
of Hereford. Great-gram 
parents are Mrs Viol 
Burchett of Portland, Oh 
gon and Mrs Potts Ford 
Wichita, Kansas

Kenm,th hitrds llarc (>irl
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n .Town Talk
B y  Ju n e  F lo y d

P h o n e  2 H - 3 H 8 I  
H ilh  l o u r  \t» ir«  I t e m

Students Chosen 
To Social Clubs

Late Friday there was quite a 
"hustle and bustle” all over town 
Many persons got busy and gathered 
vegetables which were in danger of 
freezing Saturday morning's tem­
perature readings made us realize 
we had not gathered the vegetables 
too soon.

Fortunately for the homemakers 
Hats for canning jars were available 
in local stores, so we were able to 
seal chow chow, tomatoes, soup
mixture and whatever else we 
wanted to preserve for winter 
eating.

+ + + +
Doubt that we have ever had a 

nicer fall for corn, maize and soy 
bean growers. A drive around over 
the country shows that most of the 
corn and lots of the maize has been 
harvested.

Cotton is noticeable this fall by its 
absence.

+ + + -f
Sue Gibson Naz worth, a 1953 

graduate of Friona High School and 
an employee of Russell Buick in 
Amarillo, was recently married to 
Flmo Barrett.

She is the daughter of Mr and 
Mrs. Tom Gibson of Friona

+ + + +
Recent visitors in Friona were 

Mrs Bessie Rolen of Stratford and 
her daughter. Treva Harp of 
Lubbock

+ + + +
Gary and Kay Snead spent last 

weekend In Abilene attending 
\bilene Christian College Home­
coming and related festivities.

The children. Holly and Charley, 
stayed with their grandparents. 
Rene and Jinx Snead

+ + + +
Mrs Lucy McCown and Mr and 

Mrs. Glenn Floyd have had several 
nut-of town guests recently

Mrs. Ora Wooley of Erick. 
Oklahoma, who had been visiting in 
the homes of Mr and Mrs Bill 
Wooley of Muleshoe and Mr and 
Mrs H G Wooley of Clovis, was 
here a few days

Then later Mr. and Mrs. H A 
Vaughan of Odessa. Mrs. J.C, 
Bowers of Seagraves; and Mrs
W H
here

Clements Jr of Dalhart were

Two families on West Tenth Street 
have moved. Mr. and Mrs. James 
Mabry moved into a mobile home

and Mr. and Mrs. Mickey Wilson and
children, Cody, Brady and Sham- 
bryn, moved to a farm northeast of 
Hereford.

Danny and Ada Beth Smith and 
children. Dana, Steven and Amy, 
moved from the Messenger Com 
munity into the house vacated by the 
Wilson family and Mr. and Mrs 
Lewis Smith, who were Danny's and 
Ada Beth's across the road 
neighbors, moved into the house the 
Mabrys vacated

The Danny Smiths and the Lewis 
Smiths will be living approximately 
the same distance apart, but they 
will have a lot of neighbors between
them

Then a couple of former residents 
are moving back to Friona from 
Amarillo J A. and Madge Loflin, 
who are Jerry's parents, are in the 
process of building a new home here, 
but will be living in Lewis and 
France: Smiths house in the
country until it is finished.

+  + + +
This week's Town Talk Is being 

written from Garland. We came 
down Saturday and plan to be here 
several days. Perhaps next week 
there will be a report from former 
Frionans living In this area-and, 
there are a lot of them.

One afternoon last week our 
middle daughter. Frieda Dickson, 
had an appointment with a local 
medical doctor and met up with 
Dwight Bates while she was there

Dwight is the son of Martha Bates 
and a graduate of Friona High 
School and Abilene Christian 
College He is currently employed 
by a pharmaceutical firm.

+ + + +
We cannot change yester day. that 

is quite clear
Nor begin on tomorow until it is 

here—
So all that r. left for you and for 

me.
Is to make today as sweet as it can 

be

+ + + +
Mr and Mrs Bethel Hicks of 

Seattle, Washington, visited here 
Tuesday through Thursday. This 
was their first Friona visit in 13 
years. They are former Friona 
residents He was a plumber here

They visited in the home of Mr 
and Mrs B E Sanders, and many 
other friends

Pam Wilcox and Gary White, both 
former students of Friona High 
School, have been pledged to social 
clubs on the Lubbock Christian 
College campus

Pam Wilcox, daughter of Mr and 
Mrs V R Wilcox of Friona, has 
been chosen and pledged the social 
club of Alpha Epsilon Chi

Gary White, son of Mr and Mrs 
Carl White, also of Friona. has been 
chosen and pledged the social club of 
Koinonia.

The two clubs are among the 
eleven social-service clubs available 
to students at LCC They each have a

membership of 55 for the 1975-76 
school year.

Miss Wilcox is a 1975 graduate of 
Friona High School and is enrolled 
as a freshman Liberal Arts major 
White is a 1975 graduate of Muleshoe 
High School and is also enrolled as a 
freshman Liberal Arts major.

Lubbock Christian College is a 
fully accredited senior liberal arts 
college offering liberal arts and 
pre-professional programs. The 
modern campus, consisting of II 
temporary structures and 17 
permanent buildings, is the acade­
mic for over 1300 students *

4  iro n  I i t  t e n  < lrd

National Moot
Miss

County
Jana Pronger, Parmer 
Extension Agent home 

economics, attended the 41st Annual 
Meeting of the National Association 
of Extension Home Economists 
October 27-31 in Knoxville. Tenn

"Spirit of *76'': Spotlight on
Professionalism” was this year's 
theme, and meeting goals included 
"perceiving our heritage, promoting 
professional excellence and pursu­
ing professional accountability.'' the 
agent said

Dr Virginia Y Trotter, assistant 
secretary for education-in the U.S. 
Department of Health. Education 
and Welfare--was the keynote 
speaker, and Edwin L. Kirby, 
administrator. Federal Extension 
Service. United States Department 
of Agriculture, was guest speaker at 
the Recognition Ceremony. October 
30

Other highlights 
presentation of the

included the 
Distinguished 

Service Award to six Texas county 
Extension Agents, along with 
election of officers and a "Spirit of 
'76 Dinner," hosted by the southern 
region Extension home economists 
and coordinated by Mrs Shirley 
Neel, Nacogdoches County Exten­
sion Agent and southern region 
director

Texas Distinguished Service Aw­
ard winners included Mrs Shirley 
Gray Dodd of Port Lavaca. Jetti L 
Coleman of Wharton. Mrs. Ina Lee

B eats  th e  w e a th e r !

Hybrid seed corn

MILDRED RULE
m * m  fttc u  Tfvu n o m w  j v t

MANURE 
FOR SALE

2.25 PER TON PLUS MILEAGE 
FROM HI PLAINS FEED LOT.

CALL

3 5 7 -2 5 8 5  OR 247 3673

^ b° i  a SUMMERFIELO TEXAS

20-Foot Tandems, 20-Foot Offsets 24 Discs *3850

13 A cres Of Machinery lo  Choose From,
We Buy, Sell Or Trade. If You’re Considering An Auction This Year,

Call Us For Complete Auction Service

BIG NICK MACHINERY i
Hwy. 60 PH. 238-1614 Bovina _  |

Holt of Navasota, Mrs. Irene V. 
Johnson of Lufkin. Mrs. Barbara J. 
Martin of Victoria, and Mrs. Lula M 
Pittman Spears of Angelton.

Society
Slates

Dinner
The 15th Annual Turkey Dinner, 

sponsored by St. A2" ’i Society of St. 
Ann’s Catholic Church, will be 
Sunday In Parish Hall of the Bovina
church.

Serving will begin at 11:30 a m 
and continue until 2 p m Admission 
will be $2 50 for adults and $1 50 for 
children under 12.

Menu for the annual event will be 
baked turkey and dressing, creamed 
potatoes, green beans, cabbage 
slaw, cranberries, French bread, 
pumpkin or chocolate cake and tea 
or coffee.

Door prizes will be given and a 
hand-made double-knit quilt will be 
raffled at the conclusion of the 
dinner. A Country Store will also be 
featured.

The dinner is a popular event in 
the community and a large crowd 
usually turns out each year. 
Everyone in the community is 
invited to attend.

Mrs. J. i . Finley

Jennnie McLaughlin
Weds J.V. Finley

Jeannie McLaughlin, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy McLaughlin of 
1007 Baird, Cleburne. Texas and J.V. 
Finley, son of Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Finley of Route 2, Texico, New 
Mexico, exchanged wedding vows at 
7 30 p.m Saturday. October 25.

The double ring ceremony was 
performed in the Cleburne Church of 
God by Rev. Ira Sandefur of 
Chopeau, Oklahoma.

Mrs. Susan Brown presented 
traditional wedding songs and Roy 
Turner registered guests.

As the bride was presented in 
marriage by her father, she wore a 
mint green formal length gown and 
carried a bouquet of white daisies 
with white and green lace loveknots.

Mrs. Brenda Moses, sister of the

WE
APOLOGIZE

bride, was maid of honor Royce D. 
Hume of Friona served his 
brother in-law as best man.

A reception was held in the 
Fellowship Hall of the church Miss 
Debroah McLaughlin, sister of the 
bride, and Mrs. Shirley Turner, 
cousin of the bride, served cake and 
punch.

The Finleys are former residents 
of Friona.

Mrs Finley attended schools in 
Cleburne. Finley is a 1971 graduate 
of Friona High School.

Following a short wedding trip, 
the couple will be at home on Route 1 
in Elect a. Texas, where he is 
employed at C-F Natco Corp

.... To Our Customers For The Inconvenience 
Caused Them During The Re-Modeling Work

Going On A t Our Service Station.

z \

TEMPORARILY SUSPEND GAS SERVICE AT W E ST A TION.

WHEN WE FINISH OUR WORK, WE WILL BE BETTERABLE TO 
SERVE YOU AT W E  STATION.

FRIONA CONSUMERS @ »)
824 MAIN FRIONA, TEXAS PHONE 247-2771 i

l
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FFA OFFICERS....The FFA leaders 
for Frlona High School's chapter for 
1975-7* posed this week for their 
“official photograph." Left to right 
are Kent Miller, reporter; Bobby 
Zetische, secretary; Davy Carthel, 
sentinel; Danny Campbell, vice

president; Gary Self, president; 
David Barnett, historian; Keith 
Pryor, parliamentarian and Jody 
Menefee, treasurer. Seated left Is 
Paula London, chapter sweetheart, 
and Mary Schilling, plowglrl.

Letters To Editor
YOUNG LOVERS....Sharia Benge 
and Charles Fleming are shown In a 
scene from the meller-drammer 
presented Monday and Tuesday by 
the Friona Thespian Troupe. Crowds

attending the performances enjoyed 
booing the villains and cheering the 
hero, plus throwing peanuts at the 
characters they didn’t like.

COUNTY
TREASURER'S REPORT

REPORT of Benna Kelts. County Treasurer of Parmer 
County. Texas, of Receipts and Expenditures from July 1st. 
“' w to Sept 30th 1975, inclusive

JURY KI ND. 1st Class 
Balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 
To Amount received since last Report,
By Amount paid out since last Report. Ex “A." 
balance

ROAD AND BRIDGE FIND 2d ( lass 
balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 
To Amount received since last Report, 
b> Amount paid out since last Report. Ex “B." 
balance

GENERAL COUNTY FI ND. 3d Class
Balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 
To Amount received since last Report,
C D *2104 Cashed in 
C D *2187 Purchased 
C D <2187 Cashed in 
SALARY Fees of Office 
SALARY Disbursements 
By Amount paid out since last Report. Ex "C."
By Amount transferred to other Funds, since

$1.252 80 
16 06 

1.240 00 
$28 86

$1.319 29 
16 05 

750 00 
$585 34

$51,383 11 
3.881 24 

Plus 25.000 00 
Less 2S.U00 00 
Plus 2S.U00 00 
Plus 30.369 72 
l.ess 37.461 32 
Less 41.929 03 
last Report.

To Soc/Security Less 2.321 82
Balance $28,921 90

PERM/IMPROVEMENT F IN D  Uh Class
$165 13 

16 05 
NONE 
$181 18

$13 251 73 
2 404 14 
2 000 00 

$13 655 87

$61 
31 466 71 

NONE 
$31 467 32

$5,947 07

4.000 00 
110 00

$3,820 II

307 82 
$3 512 29

Balance last Report. Filed June 30, 1975 
To Amount received since last Report.
By Amount paid out since last Report. Ex "D,"
Balance

RIGHT of MAY FIND 5th (lass 
Balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 
To Amount received since last Report.
By Amount paid out since last Report. Ex "E.”
Balance

LATERAL FIND 6th ( lass
Balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 
To Amount received since last Report,
By Amount paid out since last Report. Ex "F,"
Balance

SOCIAL SECURITY FUND 7th ( lass 
Balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 
To Amount received since last Report,
C D *1967 Cashed in 
Int on <1967
To Amount transferred from other Funds, since last Report, 

From Farm to Market Plus 2.318 29
From General Fund Plus 2.321 82

By Amount paid out since last Report. Ex “G." Levs 9.295 27 
Balance $5.40191

F AKM to M ARKET FI ND Hth Class 
Balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 $109,847 37
To Amount received since last Report, 6.998 47
By Amount paid out since last Report. Ex "H 75.457 35
By Amount transferred to other Funds since last Report. To 
Social Security 2,318 29
Balance $39,070 20

KE\ EM E SHARING FI Nl) Mh ( lass 
Balance last Report. Filed June 30. 1975 
To Amount received since last Report 

Ree d from Gov’t & Deposited 
to C D *2160 $23,282 00

By Amount paid out since last Report. EX “I,"
Balance

RECAPITULATION
JURY FUND, BALANCE $28 86
ROAD AND BRIDGE FI ND BALANCE 585 34
GENERAL COUNTY FUND. BALANCE 28 921 90
PERM IMPROVEMENT FUND. BALANCE 181 18
RIGHT of WAY FUND BA 13,655 87
LATERAL FUND. BALANCE 31.467 32
SOCIAL SECURITY FUND BALANCE S 401 91
FARM to MARKET FUND BALANCI 39.070 20
REVENUE SHARING FUND. BALANCE 3.512 29

$122 824 87
LM1 <»t Bo n d s  IND OTHER SECURITIES os HAND 

T D s for PARMER COUNTY PERMANENT SCHOOL FUND
$670 900 00

CERTIFIED DEPOSITS General Fund) 100 000 oo
rFRTIFfFD DFPOSITC of Vt v i<n non nn

tuir.u hLolMhAlloN >p»t Ace t i (,*>«

TRF \Sl HER> REPORT
From June 30. 1975 to September 30. 1975 Parmer County 

Texas
Filed vsith the vouchers accompanying same this October 

13 1975 Cwoty Clerk Parmer Counlv Texas 
Examined and approved and Vouchers canceled in open 

Commissioners' Court, this 13th day of October 1975
Presiding Officer Com r* Court 

PARMER County. Texas
THE STATE OF TEXAS 
County of Parmer

Before me the undersigned authority, on this day 
personally appeared Benna Felts. County Treasurer of 
Parmer County who being by me dully sworn upon oath, 
says that the within and foregoing report is true and correct 

Benna Felts County Treasurer 
Sworn to and subscribed before me this 13th day of 

October 1975
Bonnie Warren < lerk 

County Court Parmer County. Texas

-  The Lonely Heart

The Friona Star 
Mr. Bill Ellis. Editor 
Friona. Texas

Dear Bill:
Our father would like the enclosed 

letter printed in this week’s Friona 
Star He said you would know the 
proper placing and "framing

We, as well as Dad. appreciate so 
very much all the thoughtfulness of 
everyone in Friona. And. as always, 
such great strength is derived in 
knowing of the sincere concern of 
the people at "home."

Thank you for your help-and 
please forward the charges to me at 
the above address.

Sincerely.
Dons A Lange

+ +  + +

Dear Friends,
It is hard to realize that I'm away 

from home when each day I am 
greeted with the many cards, 
letters, calls and flowers from my 
friends in and around Friona

I want to thank the best people on 
earth for their thoughtfulness and 
gracious loving prayers that have 
indeed been a healing inspiration to 
me.

I pray your kindnesses will be 
returned to each of you a 
thousandfold

Sincerley.
Os Lange

HAS THE HARVEST SEASON 
BEEN GOOD TO YOU?

We hope so because you deserve the reward that comes from 
hard work Your dollars, also deserve the security of a strong 
financial institution where they continue to grow at the highest 
rate the law allows with insured safety up to $40 000

INTEREST RATES ON SAVINGS DEPOSITS

COMPOUNDED DAILY FROM DATE OF 
DEPOSIT TO DATE OF WITHDRAWAL

ANNUAL
RATI

ANNUAL
YIELD

5 2 5 % 539  ’

MINIMUM
TIME

MINIMUM
AMOUNT

i
&
o
u
Ou

5 7 5 * 592" 90 Days $1, 000.00
g 50 g ? 2 % 1 Ye a r $1,000.00
075"’ 098 V i Years 51,000.00
7 o t " r 725 4 Years S 1,000.00
750^ 7 7 9 - 4 Years S5. 000.00

Orbit

r
-> *

*
-<

e  u

ISN'T IT ABOUT T|M| FOR 
YOUR Tig MILLION,NINE 
THOUSAND, TWO hundred 
and Fifty mile check up ?

1973 DODGE
Vi Ton Dodge Pickup V -8 

Automatic, power M e e t  ing. |x>wer 
hruke*. air conditioning, low 

mileage; I mi lew. ( hie ( Inner.
Vi e believe thin i* the l>ewt Inn in a 

l>ickti|> in Hereford.
1971 l>OI)GK MONACO Hardtop. Air 
Gond.; Dower Steering Si liruke* I Iiim In A 

Factors Executive ( ar. Low Mileage, 
________________ 11 1 .0 0 0  M i l e .

1 9 7 1  VIA  M O l  I II S A  I H  L I T E .  2  D o o r  

H u r d  lo p .  \  ir 4 a m d . :  I ' o w e r  . E a r  f o r *  

K i r c u l i v f  ( a r .  L o w  M i le a g e ,

18 .0 0 0  M i l e a g e .

1 9 7 4  m  M O l  1 1 1 !  \ M I Y 9 - I W e n g e r

\ i i l o m a l i e .  P o w e r  S t e e l  in g  D r a k e s .

\ i r  C o n d i t i o n i n g .  L u g g a g e  It n e k .  I h i*  I*.

I h r v t d e r  K x e c u l i v e t  o r .  L o w  M i le a g e .

\ l l  L h r v u l e r  E x e c u t i v e  < u r - t  u r r v  \ 

N e w t  a r  1  a r r a n t * .

L o r  i n f o r m a t i o n  o n  a  n e w  o r  l ined  e a r ,  

c o n t a c t  D a le  J u n e * .  I e o n  I t o m o .  

D o n  l l c m d e e  o r  N i e t o r  I a n f i i

JOIN ES  
M O T O R S

345  E. FIRST HEREFORD 
PHONE 364-3150

•-

- V r

Corn Drying System

L / / { T j f l U b  6 Years $5,000.00
• fO *  tA t lV  W1TNO*AWAl CMT-nCATI iN l |» IV  w t i l  I I  <AK)
at ’vssaoex nati nus nnaitv o» *o davj intihst at
PAlsaOOA NATt

HOME office 
801 Pd* St. 

CIOVIS. N MFX

M A N C h  OFFICE 
2nd ond Ab*l*n# St 
PORTAIES, N AAEX

SAVINGS *  LOAN ASSOCIATION OF CLOVIS

•IElevator legs & boot pits 
Storage capacity 
Overhead storage bins
D n m n  n itx

uryers
*  Grain augers
•  Complete gravity flow systems 

Call at today about oar fall taler proyram
Engineering & Construction by

'AGCO
Hereford. Texas

Industries Inc.
Agri System Division 
(806) 357-2222

J
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SUPER
SAVER

CHUCK ROAST
heavy m m

FED BEEF

BONELESS
lb.

SUPPER 

SAVER

CHOCK STEAK
HEAVY GRAW 

FED BEEF

BONELESS 
Lb.

SUPER 
SAVER

BEEF CUTLETS

SUPER
SAVER

w

CROUHO BEEF
PERFECT FOR 
CHICKEN FRY

PATTIES

n
SHURFRESH

BISCUITS
SWEETMILK OR BUTTERMILK 

MIX N MATCH

S A
Cam

rA- SHURFRESH

HAM

c P  >
•£**'

BACONH
CANNED HAMS 
TURKEY HENS 
TASTY FRANKS

1 Ik Vac Pack

SHURFRESH FUUY COOKED 
S lb. Can

SHURFRESH SELF BASTW6 Ik 

SHURFRESH 12 Oz PV,

h i
om m m *- B I S

COFFEE
SNURFWE &  A A  

REG. MOP OR J  ■  ( | T  
ELEC PERK | 9

TIDE
w a n t  t|10
BOX S g l  W

rzm {

ICECREAM
PIGOLV WIGGLY 

' / * Gal.

SWEET POTATOES 
CHERRIES 
BARTLETT PEARS 
APPLESAUCE

SNURFINE 
WHOLE 

16 Oz Cih i

SMURRNE 16 Oz Com 
RED SOUR PITTED

SNURFINE 
HALVES

16 Oz Ci in
SHURFINE DELICIOUS 

16 Oz. Cbm

2/89
2/89
2/79
3176

■ \• I• -I

r PENNY'
FINCHER

L .

TOMATOES
SHURF1HE 

WHOLE PEELED

$
14 Ox .

Cam

SNURFWE 
GOLDEN 

CREAM OR 
WHOLE

MIXED VEGETABLESr 3/76( 
MANDARIN ORANGES 
CHUNK STYLE TUNA“!F 2 /8 9 *
DOG FOOD ROXEV RATION 

CANNED 15 Vt Oz Cant 71*1

t r r t  I r j lttjS t t j J

MILK
SNURFWE

EVAPORATED

Cam 
14 Vi Oz

s

***̂ _mJ  ’omTtcJ
* 3

CATSUP
QUAUIY

M  Ol  *  

M b

ORANGE D R IN K ” " " :. ',2 /8 9 * COIBV C H E E S E S ?  I ?  79< TOMATO JU IC E ?”™ *.5 9 ’  DETERGENT S R  89
TISSUE SOFUH FACIAL ZOO C« B<w  J/*1 CHEESE FOOD 89* PANCAKE MIX S R  S9< BLEACH SHURFINE 1 GH J i |  59

FROZEN FOODS PIGOLV WtOOLV FRESH PRODUCE
~ - ^ W W l  ;  ^  « -J

[fi;PW B
r

v*

SNURFINE PRi COOKED

FISH STICKS
d  SOi Ph,!

SNURRNE

ORANGE JUICE

S 6 Oz Cm
‘ i

i T

i f  HO T

PIZZAS
■89 t

POTATOES
■ ■ ■ i tRUSSET 

H U .  Dm 89
RED DELICIOUS EXTRA FANCY

T n a i i a u o A
• • « «  M « |  1 N T

CENTRAL 
AMERICAN

APPLES
. 1 1s

$BROCCOLI SPEARS 31*1 MEXICAN DINNER —  49* ONIONS W  2 /2 9
BRUSSEL SPROUTS SHURFWI M  Ot Pk| 3M DONUTS ■OtTOH MINI 14 Pool 79* CARROTSTlwjnk ê  19*

I

L -


