
JULY 4th  HOLIDAY
This newspaper office will be closed Thurs­

day, July 4, in observance of Independence 
Day. Deadline for classified ads for the Sun­
day, July 7, edition will be 5 p.m. Wednesday, 
July 3. News articles will be accepted until 10 
a.m. Friday, July 5.

AN UPDATE FROM ESTONIA
Small countries of the 

world often find their 
pleas for freedom lost in 
the political maneuvering 
between larger powers.

One of these countries 
is Estonia, which came 
alive for some Eastland 
residents last summer. 
This was mainly because 
in August 1990 Estonian 
citizens Urve Margus and 
her son, Roland visited 
here in the home of Mrs. 
Charles (Rosalie) Loreto.

Friends and family of 
Mrs. Loreto helped enter­
tain  these charm ing 
guests, who were thrilled 
with this glimpse of Amer­
ica and the way oflifehere.

While visiting last year 
Roland M argus cele­
brated his 16th birthday, 
and the Perkins family 
and other friends helped 
him enjoy the occasion.

A highlight of Roland’s 
stay in Eastland was get­
ting to play tennis with 
John Mark Vermillion. He 
felt he learned a lot from 
this skilled and friendly 
honor student.

The stay last summer 
gave Urve Margus some 
relaxation from her mis­
sion in America as a Pro­
gram Leader (Adminis­
trator) of a training school 
teaching free enterprise 
to Estonian youngpeople.

She explained that 50 
years under communism 
had made it necessary to 
re-train people in freedom 
and its business prin­
ciples. Her main destina­
tion wasCalifomia, where 
Americans assisting the 
business school worked on 
job placement for Esto­
nian young people.

For many years Urve 
Margushadhoped to visit 
the Loretos in America. 
Her only regret last Au­
gust was that Judge Char­

les Loreto had died about 
a month before.

She first met the Lore­
tos in 1971. She was a 
college student waiting 
tables in a hotel in Czecho­
slovakia, and they were 
tourists glimpsing life 
under Russian control. 
Urve’s long blonde hair 
and serene expression 
caused them to refer to 
her as ‘Our little Angel.’ 
When they left they con­
tinued to exchange letters, 
hoping to meet again 
someday.

After the visit in the 
Loreto home last August, 
Urve and Roland went to 
the West Coast and back 
to Estonia.

The last le tter Mrs. 
Loreto has received form 
Urve came in March, and 
it gave an update on her 
work and several other 
matters. She also sent 
copies of photographs 
made duringthe stay here 
in Eastland.

Portions of the letter are 
as follows:

My Dear Mrs. Rosalie 
Loreto:

Thank you very much 
that you have not forgot­
ten me and Roland. You 
are always in my mind, 
and we are very thankful 
that we had a nice oppor­
tunity to visit you and all 
last summer. It was such 
a lovely trip.

We returned from Texas 
back to California and 
then to New Jersey (we 
lived in Princeton) and fin­
ished our trip in New 
York.

We had a lot of good 
removes (parts of the trip) 
but Texas and meeting 
you was the special expe­
rience __ We like and re­
member all your friends 
who are so lovely, and 
send a warm greeting to

RANGER AUCTION 
COMPANY

The Market at Ranger 
Auction was steady on 
stocker calves, pairs and 
springers. The feedlock 
replacem ent yearlings 
sold $2.-$3.00 lower on a 
run of 475 head of cattle 
at its sale Thursday ac­
cording to Jackie Gentry, 
Reporter. There will not 
be a sale on Thursday, 
July 4th. Plain and Full 
cattle $4.00-$6.00 lower 
than goods. COWS: Fat, 
.48-.53; Cutters, .53-.58; 
Canners, .38-.48; Stock­
ers, 600.00-850.00 a head. 
BULLS: Bologna, .60-.70; 
Stockers, .70-.77; Utility,

.50-.60. STOCKER 
STEER CALVES: Choice, 
200-300 lbs., 1.17-1.40 
300-400 lbs., 1.10-1.17 
400-500 lbs., 1.03-1.08 
500-600 lbs., .89-1.02 
600-700 lbs., .90-.97 
STOCKER HEIFER 
CALVES: Choice, 200-300 
lbs., 1.10-1.20; 300-400 
lbs., 1.05-1.10; 460-500 
lbs.,.97-1.02;500-600 lbs., 
.90-.97; 600-700 lbs., .80- 
.90. COWS & CALVES: 
Good, 700.00-975.00; 
Plain, 600.00-700.00.

Read The 
County Classifieds
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FOUR MORE SENTENCED IN 
AREA DRUG ACTIVITIES

Four more area indi- . part of the plea bargain.
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them all.
Thank you for the news­

paper articles about John 
Mark.

I send to you some post 
cards about our Old Town 
part of Tallinn. It is a 
special and nice place. I 
would like to take you and 
your friends and your 
brother to Tallinn to visit 
Estonia. Mrs. Joan Sal- 
vant has also a good op­
portunity to paint our 
historic buildings. We 
have a lot of them here!

As you heard from my 
friend Marshall Fitzger­
ald, I changed my job. In 
principle I changed com­
panies . . . .  I collaborate 
with some companies 
(apparently in the field of 
communication) and that 
makes my life more inter­
esting. I have found some 
new fields of activity.

It is early spring here 
now, cold and dark days 
are over. W aiting for 
springgivesgood feelings.
I do miss seeing you (and 
others there) again. You 
are really dear to us.

Mrs. Fitzgerald will be 
here the second part of 
May. My young friend is 
still in California. He 
found the job and he’s 
doing well.

Everything is OK with 
us here. Roland goes to 
school and he has one(a) 
good business idea.

With much love to you, 
Urve and Roland

P.S. from Viola Payne, 
who compiled this article: 
thanks from the newspa­
per to Rosalie Loreto, who 
shared this interesting 
story and letter with the 
public. I was privileged to 
meet Urve Margus last 
summer, and was very 
impressed with her. I am 
amazed at how well she 
speaks and writes Eng­
lish.

My heart goes out to her 
and the other courageous 
people of the Baltic Re­
publics. May their rights 
win out over politics as 
usual.

R E V IV A L
Trinity BaptistChurch, 

S traw n, Texas. Earl 
Hughes - Evangelist from 
Georgia. Pastor - Michael 
Orsini and Song Leader - 
Ray Caudle. June 30 - July 
3, 1991 a t 7:00 p.m. 
Nightly. Special Music, 
everyone is welcome to 
attend! For more informa­
tion call 672-5835.

Eastland 
County is
OPEN

For Business
Bulldog
Booster
Report

Their will be a Bulldog 
Boosters Club meeting on 
Tuesday night at 7:00 p.m. 
in the high school cafete­
ria. Items to be discussed 
is the concession stand for 
the Ranger Junior Rodeo 
on July 18, 19, and 20th. 
All members are urged to 
attend.

BANK PRESIDENT GROVER HALLMARK: 
"YOU'VE GOT TO LIKE WHAT YOU'RE 

DOING"
Recently Eastland Na­

tional Bank President 
Grover Hallmark took 
time from a busy morning 
to reflect on his career, 
the Eastland Bank, and 
general changes in bank­
ing.

He remarked on the 
stacks of paperwork wait- 
ingat the big desk in front 
of him.

“It used to be that a 
handshake was as good 
as signinga note,”he said. 
“There’s too much legal 
work now.

“But I will have to say 
that one reason this Bank 
hasbeen successful is that 
we have kept up with the 
times, especially in the use 
of computers.”

“What would you say 
are some of the main 
qualities a Bank Presi­
dent needs these days?” 
Grover H allm ark was 
asked.

He glanced from his 
office across the spacious 
building, past employees 
and their desks, to the 
teller’s windows and the 
flow of Eastland County 
citizens.

“You’ve got to enjoy 
what you’re doing,” he 
answered. “I guess it’s the 
same way in any line of
business.”

Then he listed other 
very important ingredi­
ents of a successful Bank 
President: 1. Compassion 
for people, 2. Good com­
mon sense, 3. The ability 
to manage a business in 
accordance with sound 
business principles, and 
4. The ability to learn new 
th ings and adap t to 
change.

Those who knew Grover 
Hallmark would say that 
“learning” has been part 
of his life as far back as 
they can remember.

For there is more than 
one way to become a Bank 
President - and he took a 
long, detailed route.

Hallmark learned about 
various departments by 
working in them. He 
added to practical train­
ing by graduating from 
the Southwestern Gradu­
ate School of Banking, 
Southern Methodist Uni­
versity, Dallas.

He has also attended 
many seminars and work­
shops, one two weeks ago 
in El Paso.

Hallm ark began his 
work at Eastland Na­
tional Bank Nov. 1, 1956, 
“filing checks and sweep­
ing floors.”

“I’d like to give my credit 
in banking to Tom 
Wilson,” he said. “He was 
aspects of the bank, in­
cluding the spacious 
building, which was first 
occupied in Oct. 1980. 
Previously the band had 
been located at 114 S. 
Seaman, a site occupied 
since 1918.

The customer service, 
computerized systems, 
motor bank facilities and 
innovative programs are

part of banking at First 
National.

In Dec. 1990 Eastland 
National Bank received a 
Five S tar Rating from 
Bauer Financial Reports 
Inc., a nationally known 
research firm. A Five Star 
is the highest rating this 
firm gives, and signifies 
that the institution is one 
of the safest, most credit­
worthy in the United 
States. The bank has re­
ceived this rating in six of 
the last seven quarters.

“The economy here is 
on the upsurge,” Hall­
mark says. “It is not a 
very rapid comeback, but 
a slow growth.

“We don’t need a boom 
growth again. That led to 
the conditions after the 
oil prices dropped, with 
an effect on all service- 
related industries.

“We thought of our­
selves as being rural, 
ranching, until oil was 
found. We hadn’t really 
realized it was a solid rock 
under the economy - until 
the rock broke!”

Hallmark says the agri­
cultural economy is basi­
cally strong now, and this 
has a good effect on bank­
ing. Good local industries 
have also contributed to 
financial stability.

The main thing he is 
worried about is political 
decisions and regulations, 
he says.

“Would you believe that 
360 bills that affect bank­
ing are trying to be pre­
sented to the Texas State 
Legislature? About 350 of 
these are reported to be 
detrimental to banking, 
the Eastland National 
Bank President at that 
time, and also my loan 
officer.” He chuckled. “I 
was farm ing south of 
Carbon - married for only 
three years to my wife, 
Ruth (Beaty) - trying to 
support a family during a 
seven-year drouth.

“Yes, my father had 
been a successful farmer, 
and I thought I could be 
just as successful as he 
was. So after graduating 
from Carbon High School 
in 1950 I began farming 
peanuts and raisinghogs.”

Hallmark achieved the 
National Farmer Degree 
in 1953, and this was 
awarded to him in Kan­
sas City. But by 1956 he 
was working two days a 
week in Eastland to buy 
groceries, and trying to 
farm at the same time.

Once in his bankingjob, 
Hallmark found that he 
“enjoyed the work, and 
choose to stay with it.”

He was appointed an 
assistant cashier Sept. 1, 
1959, and promoted to 
cashier in 1963. He was 
elevated to Vice President 
and Loan Officer the next 
year, and named Senior 
Vice President in 1972. 
He was elected to the 
Board of Directors in Jan ., 
1973, and made Execu­
tive Vice President in

September of that year. 
Grover Hallmark became 
President of Eastland 
National Bank on April 8, 
1976.

Hallmark points out 
th a t Tom Wilson has 
reminded as the Chair­
man of the Board of Direc­
tors, and his service have 
been very important.

“Our Board of Directors, 
Officers and employees 
have carried this bank 
through the difficult times 
of the 1980’s,” he says. 
“They are all honest, car­
ing people, and activally 
involved in the commu­
nity.”

He is also proud of other 
‘The banking environ­

ment is changing faster 
month by month than it 
did the previous 20years!” 

Hallmark was asked 
how a young person could 
get into banking.

“Well I wouldn’t advise 
him to try my route, sim­
ply because I don’t think 
it couldbe done anymore,” 
Hallmark replied.

“In these days, I don’t 
think a young person 
would even get a chance 
to work in a bank until he 
had been to college. He’d 
n ever get to know wh eth er 
he liked the work or not.” 

“So I do advise young 
people to get all the edu­
cation they can,” Hall­
mark said. ‘T hat’s part of 
the times we live in.”

viduals arrested on drug- 
related charges were sen- 
tenced W ednesday in 
Federal Court. All had 
pleaded guilty to partici­
pating in an Eastland 
County-based drug ring.

Sentenced was Bobby 
Will Seider, 39 of 
Brown wood, who received 
33 months in Federal 
prison and five years of 
supervised release. He 
pleaded guilty to one 
count of manufacturing 
less than 100 grams of 
metharnphetamine.

Also sentenced was 
William Steven Terry, 37, 
of the Necessity Commu­
nity, (Stephens County), 
who was given a21 month 
prison sentence and three 
years of supervised re­
lease. He pleaded guilty 
,to two counts - maintain­
ing a place to manufac­
ture a controlled sub­
stance, and manufactur- 
inga controlled substance. 
The charge of manufac­
turing a controlled sub­
stance was dismissed as

Darrell Ray Pybum, of 
Early was sentenced to 33 
months in prison and a 
one-year supervised re­
lease. He pleaded guilty 
to not reporting a felony 
he knew about.

Michael Eugene Land- 
troop, 42, of Ranger was 
also sentenced. He re­
ceived 24 months in prison 
and three years of super­
vised release. Landtroop 
pleaded guilty to estab­
lishing a manufacturing 
operations.

Landtroop, Pybum and 
Seider are expected to 
surrender to authorities 
at 2 p.m. July 12 to begin 
prison terms. All the men 
were ordered to have drug 
treatment when they are 
released from prison.

This sentencing is part 
of the results of 30 convic­
tions stemming from ille­
gal drug activities. Arrests 
in Eastland County dur­
ing January, February 
and April were made by 
an Organized Crime Task 
Force.

LITTLE MISS CONTEST
Little Miss Contestheld ke awarded. Deadline to

in conjunction with the 
Ranger Jaycee Rodeo J  uly 
11,12, and 13. Three age 
divisions: 2-3, 4-5, and 6- 
8. Entry fee will be $ 10.00. 
Ribbons, Banners, Tro­
phies and Belt Buckle will

RANGER MASONIC 
LODGE

Ranger Masonic Lodge 
#738 invitesyou to be 
p resen t for a M aster 
Degree on Saturday night, 
June 29, 1991.

Supperwillbe served at 
6:30 p.m. The degree will 
follow at 7:30 p.m.

enter is July 4th. Entry 
forms can be picked up at 
Greers in Eastland and 
Ranger. For more infor­
mation call Shirley Gen­
try a t 647-1566 . ER-53

mnnnw
GET REMITS /

SHARP STATE AUDIT TURNS 
UP $5.2 BILLION

State Comptroller John 
Sharp revealed a plan 
Wednesday to save and 
raise $5.2 billion, cover­
ing the projected $5 bil­
lion deficit in the 1982-83 
State budget. The total 
budget requests were 
expected to reach around 
$48 billion.

Sharp’s report, called 
“Breaking the Mold,” was 
the re su lt of around 
54,000 hours of work by 
100 auditors. Volume 1 of 
the report is sub-titled 
“The Texas Performance 
Review,” and goes into 
many ideas on how to 
vnake State Government 
more stream lined and 
efficient.

Sweeping changes are 
advocated for schools, the 
m anagem ent of S tate  
Offices, and a number of 
State services. These pro­
posals, if approved by the 
legislature, could affect 
every county in the state. 
The legislature will con­
vene in a Special Session 
July 8.

A fter unveiling his 
“Breakingthe Mold” plan, 
John Sharp met with 
Governor Ann Richards, 
House Speaker Gib Lewis 
and Lt. Gov. Bob Bullock 
W ednesday night and 
Thursday, reportedly to 
discuss the upcoming 
Legislative Session.

By Thursday evening all

had emerged from the 
sessions, and announced 
they were in favor of the 
nearly 1,000 changes in 
the “Breaking the Mold” 
document. This appar­
ently m eant th a t Bob 
Bullock’s State Income 
Tax proposal was in 
trouble, although he has 
not indicated that.

In a letter to Editors 
around the State, John 
Sharp says that the plan 
will “lead Texas away 
from the non-stop fiscal 
crisis that have plagued 
us for the past decade.

“Breaking the Mold” 
goes beyond simply cut­
ting the budget,” he de­
clares. I am excited about 
the many recommenda­
tions that would help us 
transform State Govern­
ment into a 21st Century 
organization committed to 
quality customer service.

“I have enclosed some 
details of our recommen­
dations, including a col­
umn I hope you will pub­
lish to tell your readers of 
changes we hope to make.”

Among the key recom­
mendations in “Breaking 
the Mold” are:

• Reorganize the Texas 
Education Agency.

• Merge 25 health and 
human service agencies 
into one.

• C reate a N atural 
Resources Commission.

consolidate 
the Water Commission, 
Air Control Board, Water 
Well Drillers Board and 
Structural Pest Control-» . i

lers Board.
• Place a cap on school 

district adm inistrative 
costs.

• Consolidate s ta te  
funds. Treat Permanent
School Funds capital 
gains as investm en t
funds.

• Instill better debt 
management.

• Privatize certain state 
services, such as certain 
prison experiments, ve­
hicle and highway main­
tenance, ect.

• Im plem ent s ta te  
employee incentives for 
innovation and efficiency.

• Utilize new technolo­
gies to administer food 
stamp benefits.

• Obtain more federal 
funds for medicaid and 
child support.

• Eliminate tax filing 
exemptions and raise cer­
tain user fees.

Among the fees would 
be increasing the term of 
a driver’s license from the 
current four years to five, 
and raise the fee from $16 
to $25.

Sharp’s proposals are 
expected to elim inate 
1,043 state jobs and a 
number of offices and 
agencies. Discussion on all 
these proposals is certain 
to be intense.

But Sharp says: “What 
we have proposed in 
‘Breakingthe Mold’ is very 
much like a string  of 
Christm as tree lights. 
Every bulb is important. 
If you pull one of them 
out, the whole string goes 
dark.

“For those of you who 
oppose one or two items 
but like the rest of our 
report - remember you 
can’t have it both ways. 
We can either streamline 
s ta te  governm ent as 
proposed....or we can pass 
a tax bill to pay for the old 
way of doing things.”



\

Mrs. Janet Thomas
County Extension Agent
Texas Agricultural Extension Service

EASTLAND COUNTY 
JUNIOR 

LEADERS HOST 
FRIENDS FROM 

WEST TEXAS
By Cathy Thomas 
4-H Junior Leader 

Association
Many people in 

Eastland County may 
remember our trip to West 
Texas the previous sum­
mer. In June of 1990, 
several Eastland County 
4-H Junior Leaders had 
the chance to spend four 
days near a community 
called Van Horn, located 
in Culberson County. 
During those days, the 4- 
H’ers from Culberson 
County entertained us at 
a genuine 200,000 acre 
ranch with au then tic  
cowboy tales and cooking 
and took us to places such 
as Fort Davis and 
Carlsbad Caverns. It was 
a memorable trip for both 
counties, and this past 
week, we had the chance 
to entertain them here in 
Eastland. It took a great 
deal of money tohost these 
4-H’ers, but we had sev­
eral fund raisers this 
spring. W ithout the 
people that made dona­
tions to our car wash, bake 
sale and dogdip, this past 
week’s experience would 
not have been possible, 
and we are very grateful 
to those people and busi­
nesses.

On Tuesday afternoon, 
June 18th, several subur­
bans from West Texas 
came to a stop at our 
County Courthouse. For 
over an hour, our two 
groups talked excitedly 
andbegan gettingtoknow 
each other. Several facesj •' * •• * «„*.» n -  » i
were familiar, and while 
we chatted, the Culber­
son 4-H’ers visited 01’ Rip.

Tuesday evening’s meal 
was hosted by two Olden 
families (Nannette, Fred 
and Jessica Keith; Vicki,
Thom as and Tommy 
Seay) at the Olden Com­
munity Center. Parents 
of Eastland Junior Lead­
ers also brought food for 
the occasion. After the 
Italian meal, Tommy Seay 
entertained us with his 
‘cowboy poetry’. Also, 
Adeline and Georgia from 
Breckenridge shared vari­
ous ‘tali’ tales with our 
group. We stayed four 
daysatCamp Inspiration, 
and Tuesday night was 
spent in the swimming 
pool.

On Wednesday our two 
groups were up by six 
o’clock and at McDonald’s 
for b reak fast around 
seven-thirty. After we ate, 
we were off to Six Flags in 
Arlington. This was a 
special treat because prac­
tically no one from Cul­
berson had ever been 
there before, and by ten 
Wednesday we were walk­
ing through the large 
gates leading into the 
park. Janet Thomas and 
David Tunm ire, our 
County Agents, in ­
structed us to meet back 
by the carousel at two that 
afternoon for lunch. At 
that last note, we were 
into groups and off to ride 
the rides. Because it was 
a weekday, there were 
very few people in the 
park. The longest lines 
were at the Log Ride, the 
Flashback, and Roaring 
Rapids. After several 
rides, we were all flocking 
to the water rides to get 
drenched. Time sped, and 
after our check-in at two 
o’clock we were once free 
again in the park. 
Wednesday was an unfor-

f e ̂

gettable day for us all at 
Six Flags, and our ten 
hours there felt only like 
minutes. It was definitely 
worth the minor sunburns 
and many blisters on our 
feet. At eight that night, 
we drug ourselves out to 
the parking lot and into 
the four vehicles. From 
there  we w ent to 
Cheddar’s, an excellent 
restaurant just outside 
the park, for our long- 
awaited evening meal. 
A fterw ards, we again 
piled into the cars. It was 
an exciting night - espe­
cially when we got lost 
and made four circles 
around some hotel in it 
parking lot. Several hours 
later we drove through 
E astland  - probably 
around twelve. Even the 
beds at Camp Inspiration 
seemed comfortable after 
being tossed around on 
rides all day and then 
being packed into vehicles 
for the drive home.

Six o’clock came ex­
tremely early Thursday 
morning; however, we 
were all up and 
dressed...well, everyone 
except for three anony­
mous guys from Eastland 
County. Soon, though, we 
were again eating break­
fast at McDonald’s. That 
morning’s agenda: Fossil 
Rim, an enormous wild­
life park located in Glen 
Rose. The animals there 
were fascinating, and the 
trip was worthwhile when 
R. W. Daskevich got at­
tacked by an overly- 
friendly ostrich. Tanner, 
a toddler from Culberson 
whose mother is Crystal 
Wilbanks, spent most of 
the time hanging out of 
the suburban’s window 
enjoyingthe animals. Also 
hanging out a suburban 
window was Jackie 
Powledge who had to stop 
and get a picture of EV­
ERY animal we saw. No 
tellinghow many pictures 
he took!!!!! Lunch was

spent in the visitor’s cen­
ter, and afterward we got 
the chance to shop in the 
gift shop and meet quite a 
few animals at the ‘pet­
ting pasture’. Several of 
us purchased tee - shirts 
which featured endan­
gered animals, and the 
proceeds went to funds to
help them. We definitely 
learned a lot about vari­
ous animals - especially 
that zebras DO bite!

Thursday evening was 
spent at Albany and the 
annual Fandangle. 
Hardly anyone had been 
there from Eastland, so it 
was a new experience for 
us all. The night was filled 
with gunshot, singing and 
Dan’s laughter. Another 
thing was new to the 
Culberson County 4-H’ers 
— lighting bugs. JaSv»n 
was talking afterwards 
about how he couldn’t 
figure out what the blink- 
ing lights were th a t 
seemed to be floating 
around us. He was aston­
ished to find out that they 
were bugs as were many 
of the Culberson kids. We 
again re tu rned  to 
Eastland lat that night 
and welcomed sleep. It 
had been another fun and 
exhausting day for us all.

Early Friday morning 
we told the Culberson 
County people goodbye. 
They hit the road for their 
eight-hour drive back 
home while we tried to 
stay awake long enough 
to pack out things and 
head for homes ourselves. 
It was yet another memo­
rable trip for us all.

Ten Eastland Junior 
Leaders hosted this trip. 
They were:

Ricky Agnew (Cisco), 
C hristy  A rther
(Eastland), Barbie Butler 
(Eastland), R. W. Das­
kevich (Carbon), Robbi 
Daskevich (Carbon), Amy 
Logan (Eastland), Jen ­
nifer Jarrell (Eastland), 
Jackie Powledge (Cisco), 
Cathy Thom as
(Eastland), and Joanna 
Wallace (Ranger). We also 
had five special guests: 
Diane Butler, Jessica 
Keith, Tommy Seay, Di­
ane and Nicole Tunmire. 
We Junior Leaders would

CJC Sum m er R eg istra tio n  
To B e H eld  On J u ly  11

R egistration for the 
second summer session at 
the Cisco Junior College 
campus will be held on 
July 11 from 9 a.m. to 4 
p.m and from 6 to 8 p.m.

Day classes held on 
Monday through Thurs­
day will be General Biol­
ogy (Zoology) from 8 a.m.

like to thank our parents 
thathelped transport and 
cook, and again our com­
m unity of E astland  
County.
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AUTO GLASS

☆  it  it  it  it  <t it  t r  <r *  ir  4  £

314 W. Main J 
Eastland - 629-3251 t

<*
Ralph Tucker *

O w n e r  £
•a

* Commercial Glass * Auto Glass * 
* Residential Glass * Tinting $

* Mirrors l

FREE MOBILE SERVICE |
1-800-262-7369 t

*☆ ☆ ☆ ☆ ☆ ******** * * * * * * * * * *  **********

Dr. Bill Watkins 
General Dentistry

B r e c k e n r id g e

T O L L  F R E E  
1 -800-725-2420 ccr57

a r i s i n g  S  t a r

H ere is  an oth er  truck  load  o f  tires  at J o e  H udspeths  
G oodyear in  E astland .

P a r a d e  D o w n to w n  10 a .m .
L in e u p  a n d  J u d g in g  a t  9  a .m . a t  H ig h  S c h o o l  

H o m e m a d e  Ic e  C rea m  J u d g in g , A fte r  P a r a d e , A t P a r k
•

M u s ic ia n s  F r o m  A ll O v e r  E n te r ta in , C lin ic  G r o u n d s  
B B Q  B r is k e t  L u n c h , C a te r e d  b y  J . C. C o o k ,

C lin ic  G r o u n d s

*>

A rts  & C ra fts  B o o th s , P a r k  10 x  12 S p a c e  $10  
F u n  & G a m es fo r  A ll A g es

G ir ls  S o ftb a ll  T o u rn ey , B e g in s  A t 8 a .m ., B a ll P a r k  
S ta te  P la y -O ff  R is in g  S ta r , C ly d e ,

J im  N ed , W in ters  te a m s

\

/
7 B in g o  - 2 p .m ., A m e r ic a n  L e g io n  H a ll, S . M ain  

C ity w id e  G a r a g e  S a le s  - M ore th a n  26 L o c a t io n s  -
M ap s P r o v id e d  

J u n io r  R o d e o  - 8 p .m . J u ly  4, 5, 6  - 
R o d e o  G ro u n d s, H ig h w a y  36  E a s t

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
Freedom Festival Sponsored by Rising Star Chamber o f Commerce <4 Agriculture

to 1 p.m. and bowlingfrom
10 to 11:55 a.m.

Night classes held on 
Monday and Wednesday 
nights will be Reading in 
English Literature, His­
tory of the U.S. Since 
Reconstruction, Trigo­
nometry, and Develop- 
mental Writing from 6:15

to 10:15p.m. Tuesday and 
Thursuay night classes 
are English Composition 
and Rhetoric, State and 
Local Government, Ele­
m entary Algebra, and 
Developmental Reading.

The first class day is 
July 15.

For more information, 
contact the Cisco Junior 
College Admission’s office 
at (817) 442-2567

FOR SALE
Double Drum Wich Tex, Waukeshaw 

Power, Double Telescope Poles 
C65 Chevrolet Truck, 10,200 miles

$35,000.00 
Call 915-784-6392 CER53

PICKRELL REAL ESTATE
Residential-Land-Commercial

817-647-3582
111 W. Main St., Ranger, Tx. 76470

^bc?f 1°ka^^nicc*carpel, new roof, central air/gas furnace, metal siding
with fresh paint, ceiling fans, 1 car garage, nice covered patio, pecan,
apple, oak trees, owner/ageni
8 lots in Meadowbrook addition owncr/brokcr
22 lots in Oakhill Subdivision owner/agent
House - 317 Pierce Street, Ranger.
Lake Leon - 2 BR, 1 1/2 bath, cen h/a, deeded lot. Staff Meter, ceiling 
fans, fireplace, satellite dish, fishing dock, 3 storage sheds, steel siding, 
storm windowsl trees, located close to country club, lots of extras 
Excellent Location - nice office building with kitchen, 2 bathrooms, 3 
offices, one very large office with book shelves, 2 file rooms, central 
H/A lots of storage.
2 bd, 1 bath, 3 lots frame house $14,500.00 
4 bd, 2 bath, carport, frame house $18,000.00 
Yellow Rose trailer park-spaces available for rent 
~ *“ * "roDerlv

tween Halbryan and Bassett strceL owner/agentresiden ots
i[ton-commercial building in good location. Approxi­

mately 1,395 square f t
cage
acres north of Ranger-3 bd, 2 bath, house, new bam and corrals, 

nice new garage. 3 ponds, water well, water meter, minerals. Lots ofnice new garage, j  puuus, waiw wcu. w aiti m t i t i .  m uiviou.
wildlife, excellent deer hunting. $116,000.00 Stephens County 
79 Acres south of Ranger-LeonRiver runs through middle La rgefield 
and pecan trees, water well and pond. Mineral rights $58,000.00. 
Eastland County
100 acres west of Ranger, coastal, large tank, good cattle pasture or 
home site. S90,000.00 Eastland County
DEER HUNTERS-160 acres-1 well stocked pxpnd, post oak-native 
pecan-elm, approximately 50% wooded, 1/16 mineral, producing oil 
and gas well, very good deer and turkey hunting. $550.00 per acre 
Eastland County . .
Check with us for farm/ranch and hunting property listings.

j
David D. Pickrell, B Mildred PickreU
REALTOR-Broker REALTOR-Broker

(817)647-5141 ’
Shawn Wells 

REALTOR-ASSOCIATE 
(817) 647-3009

CFR104

Muscles in knots? 
Nerves in a pinch?

Call Now!
♦Whiplash 
♦Neckpain 
♦On-the-job Injury 
♦Headaches 
♦Low Back Pain 
♦Athletic Injury

Private Insurance 
Workman’s Compensation 
Personal Injury Insurance 
Medicare-Medicade

Open 8:30-5:00 
Mon.-Wed.-Fri. «

Jo Thomas, D. C.

THOMAS

CHIROPRACTIC
629-3311
Shady Oaks 

Shopping Ctr.
(next to Play-off Sports)

Read The 
Classifieds

Cisco Press - Eastland 
Telegram - Ranger 
Times- Sunday,

June 30,1991

M.H. Perry 
Insurance

104 N. Lamar 
Eastland, TX

Phone 629-1566

• Life Insurance 

•Hospitalization

• Group

• Cancer

• Supplement

• Medicare

CER104

JUST SAY CHARGE IT!

Invicta GS
All-Season 

Performance, 
Long Term 

Mileage Capability
• Rain-dispersing criss­

cross tread grooves
• Full-depth winter 

traction shoulder 
grooves

• Smooth, quiet ride 
enhances the

WKlcWALl PRICEMrui
PteV50«13 (S9.95r l - —- P16S/7SR14 (74.50

» L P195.75RU (76.50
P20V7SR14 (78.95

performance of any 
vehicle

ViTCTEWALL PRICE
S 8 Ml'ME *IM»

P20S/75R15 (83.50
P215/70R I5 (89.95
P21S/75R15 (8  6. SO

Other sues available

6 0 ,0 0 0
W arran ty
R o ta t io n

V*

Mile  W e a r - O u t  
— F R E E  L i fe t im e  

and B a la n c e

G O O D Y E A R
E A G L E  S T

Parlormoncn Radiol far 
Musdn (ori, Vans 
and Span Rick-Ups

<  /  /  /%  JP  P17SS0 R13
R e a t o  W hitt i t n t f t
NO TiiOt N t tO tC

RAUKT W>CTt
Lrrro«ai

nca*•

P19570R13
P19570R14
P20570R14
P21570R14

$71.00
$75.00
$79.00
$81.00

*AUKD WMJT1 
LXTTTX C l

n u c i
*• Tvw

P21565R15
P22570R15
P23070R15
P25570R15

$64.50 
$86.50 
$69 00 
$97.00

Other s ilts  MiUWe ♦BUckwil

TIRE & APPLIANCE
3 1 5  E . M a in  629-2662

Goodyear Credit Card • Our Own Credit Plan • American Express • Visa • Discover • MasterCard

W R A N G L E R  
O n e  T o u g h  T ir eGOODYEAR 

INVICTA GL
All Season Troclion lor 
Imports and Comports

* 3 6 .9 5 Bue* S«” E'9C ltn«t Me ‘>h : k

iua stwuTio unit tizi
metli Fill knot

P1SVB0«!3P16S.WU3Pl7S/tO«U3P17S/70R13
S40 IS S4| 9S SSI.95 S54 95

1 jci iiuuno urn* sac NUClHi lift kiHit
PltS/70«13Plt&/70AKP19S.70R14P20S70R14

IS7.9S S59 9S $63 9S $66 95
Oirw s>:ts i*i i5n

GOODjpYEAR  
INVICTA GL
New Generotvn Bodiol 

lor Aeredrnomk 
Vehicle besign

WMlTlWUl
SIZE

r a i d
Mo Trod 
Molded

WMlTlWUl
SIZE

PAlCl 
No Viet 
hooded

p i s s er*-3 143 95 P20S/7SRU SIT.95
PUS 75*14 SI1.9S P?C5 70R14 170 95
P i |S ? 0 B i4 563 93 P20S7$*i5 171 IS
P’.5S7SS’4 164.IS P 2 '5 7 5 ^ 5 175.IS

t o * ' »:n  m  i m

45,000 Mile 
Wear-Out Warranty!

B u d g e t  P r ice  P a s s e n g e r

DECATHLON
Steel Belted Strength 

On A Budget

* 2 7 .9 5  tatitM i
w x i T r a u

SIZE/
MICE 

Na t u n  
ha iled

PliS 7SN14
H95.7SR14
P70V75X14
P7CS7SA1S

136 IS 
13? IS 
S3I IS 
140.13

WHITE* I I I  
SIZE

PRICE 
h i  *»!• 
hooded

P21S/7SP1S
PZZSTStiS
P73S.7SN1S

142 IS 
U4 IS 
14? IS

g o o d / y e a r

TIEMPO
Steel b l in d  Sir m y th , 

All-Season Troclion

*34.95PlSVSOAl) WTwi«»*f 
Nt Irate Nato*4

WHITEWAU
SIZE

PRICE 
Ho V»di 
Hooded

P165/S0R13
P10S/60B13
pies/75Fm
P19S/75R14

(45.15
549.95
554.95
557.95

WHITEWALL
SIZE

PRICE 
He Trade 
Hooded

P20S/75R14 
P20S/7 5Rl 5 
P235/75R15

359.95 
363 55 
573.15

Other sires m iUM e.

40,000 Mile Wear-Out Warranty!

g o o d / y e a r
WRANGLER AT
Ingioeered I f  Senhrd 

OH The Bead
j Size, Sidewall 
1 & Load Range

PRICEho in FET
( LT23575R15 BSL C SH. .
< imS75Rl$0VA. C $91 •
) LTOSBRlSRa 0 $110. •
I LT23S-BRI6BSI E $119. S3j lT2457$fii6BS E $121. if

IS. •  L n  S r «  Ira n  0*0. •  Owe * * »  i n r  Oar im  n  e t

V A C A T IO N  D R IV IN G  S E R V IC E  S P E C A L S

Rotate/Balance
• 4 Wheel $ O l O O  
•13-14-15 A l

Brake Reline
•Insta ll Pads <12 C \  0 0  
•Turn R otors ^
•R epack B earings

I Auto Air Conditioner 
I Service $1095
I  Inc ludes 1 lb. freon  *

Wheel Alignment
M ost US Cars M L  A A *  
•P ick-ups ^  M  l | v w  
S lightly H igher

G ■W,YEAR
Just Say  C h arg e  Itl

jr iy il

TIRES
Look to us fo r tires and serv ice !

57577SERVICE

4th of July Special
3'X5' American Flag with 6' 
3 pc. Pole and Hardware

L I M I T  O N E

PEOPLE • GOODYEAR
$fl99
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Gibson Resigns As Head 
RJC Basketball Coach

J u ly  4th  F reedom  F estiv a l 
To B e H eld  In R isin g  Star

Mr. and Mrs. W eem s D ykes

Do You Know 
Weems Dykes?

By J.B. W orthy
Time to turn tables: 

Weems w rites about 
people he meets, so it’s 
only fair that he should be 
written about.

Fresh out of seminary 
in 1945, Weems Dykes 
came to Eastland as pas­
tor of the First Christian 
Church. Fresh into retire­
ment, he and Verne, his 
wife, bought a home here 
in ’83.

Sem inary tra in ing  
>stood him in good stead 
for the 42 years in the 
pulpit that it took to bring 
him back to Eastland. Re­
tirement training didn’t 
work as he now writes his 
news column, pastors a 
church in Richland%
Springs (Brown Co.), vis­
its nursing homes, volun­

teers as chaplain atEMH, 
presides at AARP meet­
ings, susbstitues for 
teachers in Eastland, 
Ranger and Cisco, and is 
a member of Cisco 
Writer’s Club.

In addition, Weemsand 
Verne are extra-doting 
grandparents for Ashley, 
Bradley and Wesley, prog­
eny of their only child, 
Jane.

Ashley and Bradley are 
old enough to crawl in ‘the 
big bed’ for the chuckle- 
provoking yarns and bits 
ofhis own poitry that are 
Weems’ specialty. ‘When 
they go to sleep, I carry 
them off to their own beds.’ 
He says is fondly, and you 
know Wesley won’t be 
unwelcome when he joins 
his brother and sister in

Coach Larry Gibson, 
B asketball Coach at 
Ranger Junior College, 
recently announced his 
plan to return to the class­
room to pursue a gradu­
ate degree at Texas A & I 
University. He will work 
with the basketball pro­
gram there while complet­
ing work on his Master’s 
Degree.

Larry first came to RJC 
in the fall of 1973 as a 
member of Coach Ron 
Butler’s basketball team.

that big bed.
Weems had five sisters 

and two brothers. ‘There 
are four of us left,’ he said. 
‘When we lost our first 
(sibling), we had been to­
gether 62 years.’

Verne and Weems have 
been together since 
Christm as Day, 1962, 
when they wed in The 
Church ofthe Good Shep­
herd in Fort Worth. Verne 
will be remembered as the 
daughter of the late J.C. 
and Lillie May Allison — 
but that’s another story.

Among other honors, 
Weems is a past poet lau­
reate ofTexas, and he con­
tributed a poem for 1944 
to the Poets Laureate book 
published for the Texas 
Sesquicentennial.

Weems is no Greek, but 
like them, he usually ‘has 
a word for it’ — whatever 
‘it’ happens to be.

During his two years at 
Ranger he earned a spot 
on the All-Conference 
Team his freshman year, 
the only freshman to earn 
that distinction that sea­
son. He left RJC in 1975 
after earning All-Confer­
ence honors again and 
played out his collegiate 
career at McMurry in 
Abilene.

Larry re tu rned  to 
Ranger Junior College in 
1981 and coached the 
men’s team for ten years 
and both men and women 
five. For eight of the past 
ten years, Coach Gibson 
has led his team to the 
Regional Tournament, 
and in 1988 his men’s 
team was runner-up in the 
competition. This year, 
both men’s and women’s 
teams participated in the 
Region V Tournament.

Rising Star's Fourth of 
July Freedom Festival 
will be full of activities 
and entertainment.

A girs (14 and under) 
softball tournament with 
teams from Rising Star, 
Clyde, Jim Ned and Win­
ters will start the activ- 
ites at 8 a.m. Three of the 
teams are headed for the 
State play-offs. A conces­
sion stand will be open.

Parade line up and judg­
ing will begin at 9 a.m. at 
the high school building 
and the parade moves 
downtown at 10 a.m.

A homemade ice cream 
contest will be held after 
the parade at the Colquitt 
Williams Memorial Park, 
500 Highway 36 W.

A lunch of BBQ brisket, 
sausage and more will 
begin at 11 a.m.

Many musicians, in-

S o c i a l  S e c u r i t y  J u l y  S c h e d u l e

The Social Security 
representatives will be in 
Eastland at the Park Hill 
Senior Citizen Center 
Tuesday, July 2, and 
Tuesday, July 16 at 9:30 
a.m.

The budget crisis has 
affected the Social Secu­
rity adm inistration in 
several ways. Oneofthese 
is that we have less money 
to pay travel expenses. So, 
we have had to reduce our

C isco P ress - E astlan d  T elegram  - 
R anger T im es

Sunday, June 30, 1991

Cisco Radiator Service
207 E. 6th - Cisco

Cleaning, Roddingand Repairing Radiators 
Since 1958, here since 1973. All kinds of 
radiators cleaned, rodded and repaired. 
Brass-Copper, Copper-Plastic, Aluminum-

l . ‘ i  • O  i l  11 J T
Plastic.

Call 442-1547 CIJS104

Paul Williams Roofing Co.
• FREE Estimates •

• All Work Guaranteed •
• Hot Tar & Gravel Composition •

• Shingles • T-Locks • Wood Shingles •
25 Years Experience In Eastland Area
Paul Williams Carbon, Texas

817-639-2330
I f  No Answer Call 817-629-1020 chum

High-Performance 
Notebook Computer

travel schedule. We regret 
the inconvenience and will 
resume our normal travel 
schedule, when and if, 
funds are made available.

You can call Social Se­
curity toll-free each busi­
ness day, 12 hours per day, 
from 7:00 a.m. - 7:00 p.m. 
1-800-234-5772.

R JC  To S p o n s o r  
S e r ie s  C la s s e s  In  
B a s k e tw e a v in g

Ranger Junior College 
will sponsor a series of 
instructional classes in 
the art of basketweaving. 
These classes will be held 
from 7:00 PM to 9:00 PM 
on Tuesday evenings 
during the month of July, 
beginning July 9th and 
ending July 30th. Class 
instructor will be Mrs. Pat 
Gohlke. Mrs. Gohlke has 
just returned from Colo­
rado, where she attended 
the YMCA Camp of the 
Rockies and received 
tra in in g  in num erous 
aspects of the art of bas-

cluding Cisco's Country 
Express, will entertain.

There will be fun and 
games for all ages.

Citywide garage sales, 
with maps to find the 26 
or more locations, will be 
held.

Bingo games will begin 
at 2 p.m. at the American 
Legion Hall, 205 S. Main. 
Payout will be the maxi­
mum allowed.

The Junior Rodeo will 
be held at 8 p.m. July 4, 5 
and 6 at the rodeo grounds 
just east of town. Admis­
sion is $2 for adults and 
$1 for children. A conce- 
sion stand will be open.

Rising Star is the place 
to be July Fourth!

V B S  To H e ld  A t 
R o sa r y  C a th o lic  
C h u r c h  In  J u ly

Vacation Bible School 
will be held Monday 
through Friday, July 22- 
26, from 6:30 until 8:30 
p.m. at Holy Rosary Par­
ish Hall in Cisco.

Theme of school, which 
is open to E astland 
County children of all 
denominations, will be 
“Welcome to Glory Days.” 
The school will be for ages 
three to 14 years.

Each evening’s activi­
ties will have a special 
theme. Monday will be 
“God Calls;” Tuesday, 
“God Unites;” Wednesday, 
“God Guides,” Thursday, 
“God Heals,” and Friday, 
“God Gives Joy.”

For more information, 
contact Janelle Schrader 
at 442-3329.

ketweaving. During this 
course, Mrs. Gohlke will 
provide useful instruc­
tion, interesting demon­
stration, and hands-on 
training in the weaving of 
baskets. Interested per­
sons are encouraged to 
register as early as pos­
sible by calling RJC Con­
tinuing Education Office 
at 817-647-3234.

CHILD ABUSE 
24 HOUR HOTLINE 

1-800-252-5400
u win> ny

‘B e i t  ‘D r a p e r i e s

C u s t o m  O r d e r
Mini-Blinds • Vertical Blinds

HALF PRICE
Call 817-629-1319

1706 W. Commerce Hwy. 80 W Eastland^
M M

^ R e s c u e  L in eN
Battered, abused, alcoholism, suicidal, 
divorced, troubled marriage, etc.

There is free help  for  
E a stla n d  County Women

L isten  to KVMX 97 F.M. 442-4479
6:00-7:00 Monday night C E R ltM

: ■>

INTRODUCING 
EASTLAND’S

NEW
DOCTOR

Meet

Dr. Stephen G. Barry
CHIROPRACTOR 

951 E. Main 
Eastland

Most
Insurance Accepted

IF YOU’RE SUFFERING FROM 
ANY OF THESE SYMPTOMS, 
CALL TODAY AND SEE WHAT 
CHIROPRACTIC CAN DO FOR 
YOU. !'

•Headaches *Neck Pain
•Shoulder Pain *Back Pain 
•Arm Pain *Hip Pain

Muscle Spasms 
Numbness 
Leg Pain

LIVE THE GOOD LIFE AGAIN 
Through Good Healtjv And Wetln

Call 6 2 9 - 1 7 7 lToday
CER 52

R e g .  1 9 9 9 .0 0  
L o w  A s  S 4 3  P e r  M o n th  •

Tandy 1500 HD  ■ 640K  RAM  
4 -H o u r B a tte ry  L ife  ■ U n d e r 6 lbs.

Eastland Office Supply/ 
Radio Shack Dealer

111 VV. Main Eastland
" Your Southwestern Bell Cellular Agent1'

Portable Entertainer! 
AM/FM/TV-Sound Radio

25% Off
CB for Summer Travel 

Fun and Safety 2 9 9 5 R e g .
3 9 .9 5

*25-3506

# 2 5 -1 6 0 3  M o n ito r  e x tra

286-Based P 
For Home or Office

Save s500
5993?^  1 0 9 9  9 5

L o w  A s  S 2 0  P e r  M o n t h .
■ Tandy? 1000 T L /3  PC

Save S711 on TL/3 System with 
CM-5 color monitor and 20MB 
hard drive Reg separate items 
1799 85 #25-1603/1043/1047. 
Sale 1088 00

Includes 
2 0 M B  

Hard Drive 
And

C o lo r  M o n ito r

The Home PC That 
Guarantees Success!

Save s300
9 9 9 9 0^  W  W

1 2 9 9  9 0
L o w  A «  S 3 0  P e r  M o n t h *

■ Tandy 1000 R L
■ In c lu d e s  24 H o m e -O rie n te d  

S o ftw a re  A p p lic a tio n s

Versatile, Triple-Mode 
Personal Printer

Cut s160
199??

3 5 9 .9 5
L o w  A s  S15 P e r  M o n t h *

W o rd  P rocess ing . D ra ft 
A n d  G ra p h ic  M odes

29% Off 4995
R e g  6 9  9 5

W ith  O ur CB You’ ll N ever H ave to 
D rive  ‘A lo n e " Again
#21-1509

Keep u p  W ith  S oaps ,
S p o rts  o r N e w s  at 
B each . P oo l. Wherever ,12.640

#26-2848

7-Band, 40-Watt Car 
Equalizer/Booster

33% Off
* '2 - 1 9 5 5 3 9 95

Le ts  You C u s to m iz e  Your A u to  S o u n d  
10 -Leve l P ow er O u tp u t M e te r .  F ade r C o n tro l 

ron t P ane l Ja ck  fo r C o n n e c tin g  a C D  P laye r

10-Channel Scanner 
For Police/Fire Action

40011 89??

VHS Hi-Fi Stereo VCR—That’s Entertainment!

cut iso 2 9 9 95 : O n -S c re e n  P ro g ra m m in g  
1-Y ear/6-E vent T im e r

R e g .
129.95

H ave D irect A cc e ss  to 
O ve r 22 .000  F re q u e n c ie s  
#20-126

L o w  A s  $15  P o r  M o n t h  • Reg. 449.95 # 1 6 -6 1 7 24-Watt Digital 
AM/FM Car Stereo

Our Big-button Phone Is 
A Conversation Piece!

Cut 20%

%

Dual-Cassette Stereo 
Music System

Save s70 1 4 9 "
Low Aa $15 Por Month* Reg. 219.95

■ S yn c h ro -S ta rt D u b b in g  ■ A M /F M
■ S e m i-A u to m a tic  T u rn tab le

# 1 3 -1 2 4 0  /

Cut s50 9995
L o w  A s  $ 1 5  P e r  M o n th  •  R e g  1 4 9 .9 5

■ A u to  R e ve rse  ■ 5 -B a n d  EQ
■ A u to -E je c t ■ Seek

# 1 2 -1 9 3 0

3 9 9 5 Rey.
4 9 .9 5

" H o ld ”  B u tto n  
A m p lif ie d  H a n d se t 
T o u c h -R e d ia l #43-338 Tone/pulse dialing

INTEREST!
AND NO PAYMENT UNTIL OCTOBER! 
NO DOWN PAYMENT!

Color TV/VHS 
Player

0 ^  interest and no payment until October on approved RSVP“ 
account with single ticket purchases totaling $100 00 or more 
Following the no-mterest penod any remaining balance is sub­
ject to a finance charge of up to 21% APR depending on your 
state ot res»dence (50c minimum monthly finance charge) Refer 
lo your RSVP Account Agreement Hurry, offer is valid June 12 
through July 6 1991

Save -1003 9 9 9 5
Cordless Telephone

~ ' 69??
L o w  A s  1 1 5  P e r  M o n t h *

■ R e m o te  ■ C a rry  H a n d le
■ P lays on AC o r C a r DC

# 1 6 -4 0 4

R e g
4 9 9  9 5

R e g
119.95

3 -N u m b e r O ne-Touch D ia lin g  
A u to -S e t S e c u rity  C ode
*4 3 -5 5 8  Tone/pulse d ia ling



Tara’s L ittle  H am s To A ppear  
In S tep h en v ille  J u ly  2 And 4
The children squeal 

with delight as the pigs 
take center stage in their 
portable arena. They 
laugh and applaud as 
Doyle and F rances 
Hughes direct the little 
guys to sit, dance, play 
piano, walk in patterns 
through the trainers’ legs, 
go through hoops, ‘drive’ 
a toy car, and do a large 
number of other tricks. 
One little pig even purses 
out his lower lip imper­
sonating a monkey at the 
command of ‘let us see 
your monkey face, Rhett’! 
Doyle says, To our knowl­
edge, this is the only pig 
in the world who can do

this trick on command.’ 
These are Tara’s Little 

Hams, and they are proba­
bly the only entourage of 
performingminiature pot­
bellied pigs in this part of 
the country. Frances said 
she only knows of one 
other group of performing 
potbellies, and they live 
in California. Tara’s show 
is available for children’s 
birthday parties and for 
other events. Children 
and adults alike enjoy the 
little porkers, and Doyle 
said he would challenge 
anyone to try to watch 
Rhett do h is‘monkey face’ 
trick and keep a straight 
face.

The pigs are scheduled 
to appear for the McKids 
breakfast at McDonald’s 
in Stephenville on July 2, 
at 8:30 a.m. and will also 
be appearing at the Fun 
Fair in Stephenville on 
July 4, at 1:30 p.m. on the 
Small Pavillion Stage.

T ara Farm s located 
north of Desdemona is 
home to Rhett Butler and 
Ashley Wilkes, the two 
primary show pigs. There 
are other pigs coming up 
who will probably join the 
group later as soon as they 
are trained by the resi- 
dent'swineologists’, Doyle 
and Frances. There are 
some baby pigs up for

MEET WALDO...
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adoption at Tara, among 
which are some females 
with blaze faces and very 
broad belting. The 
Hughes’ only deal in reg­
istered, high quality stock.

Q uestions they are 
asked most often are: Can 
you really housebreak 
them, how long do they 
live and what do they eat. 
The Hughes’ say they 
have been highly success­
ful with housebreaking. 
The pigs have a surpris­
ingly superior in te lli­
gence, and are housebro- 
ken by nature. With just a 
little assistance from the 
owners, housebreaking is 
much easier than with a 
dog. With propercare, the 
pigs can be expected to 
live supplemented with 
fruits, vegetables and

By Richard Herrera
If you knew what 
I know and know 
what I knew what 
would you know?

(Answer below)

occasional treats. Some 
feed manufacturers make 
special blends for the 
miniatures, and porcine 
residents of Tara all get 
these balanced rations. 
Care must be given to 
limit treats or the pigs will 
gain too much weight. 
Rhett and Ashley are over 
six months old and they 
each weigh between 35 
and 40 pounds. Adults’ 
weights will vary. Normal 
expectations would be 45 
to 70 pounds.

Doyle and Frances 
would welcomeyour ques­
tions. They can be reached 
at Tara Farms, (817)758- 
2662, or you can write 
them at Route 1, Box 16B, 
Desdemona, Texas 76445.

Read The 
Classifieds
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1SEEDS 
FROM 
THE  
SOWER'
Michael A . (iuido Mnicf.Iieivxia

One day I visited a home and 
I heard a woman wail, “ Poor
me. ii

MEET WALDO -  H e’s th e com ic cap tion  
o f A rtist R ichard  H errera o f E astland , 
and you'll be se e in g  th e  an tics o f W aldo

Your Special Invitation...

on  th ese  p ages as h e  fa ces  th e litt le  
fo ib les o f  life  th a t con fron t us all. Look  
for him .

“ Vyhat's the m atter?”  I asked.
"M y  mom had a little trouble.”  

said her daughter, "a n d  she's 
having a p ity-party."

But the true expression of a 
Christian isn ’t a sigh, it's  a song.

Look at our Lord. He was 
about to be betrayed with a kiss 
and brutally crucified. And His 
disciples were about to be scat­
tered and slain. How did they 
spend that night? Sighing? No, 
singing. The Saviour led them in 
a song.

Are you facing dark days? 
Don’t have a pity-party and pout, 
try praising. Turn care into 
prayer, and sing the clouds 
away.
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•C h U r c

I f  y o u  l ik e  to  h e a r  a b o u t

The pastor, and international speaker, John 
C. Jones presents the "living Christ" through 
the message of "faith" weekly. The congre­
gation is a inter-denomination worship 
center where people from all walks of life 
and religious experience come to study 
God's Word.

A Church of "Signs & Miracles"

Service Times ________
Sunday 10:30 a.m. 6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday 7:30 p.m.

"Where going to church is fu n "

This week, join those’who drive from a 100 mile 
radius each week to attend a church that is 
"Delightfully Charismatic."

608 E. 8th 
Cisco, TexasPh. 442-2673 Ph. 442-4479

OF AMERICA

Fullen Motor Co.
305 East Main Eastland 629-2676
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TRUCKS! TRUCKS! AND MORE TRUCKS!!!
Fullen Motor Co. is pleased 
to announce that we w ill 
honor GMC’s $500.00 direct 
mail coupon towards the re­
tail purchase or retail lease of 
any new 1990-91 C/K Pickup 
or Chassis-Cab.
This a llow s you up to a 
$1500.00 rebate on select 
models. Customers can use 
their coupon as down pay­
ment or receive cash back in 
the form of a check from 
Chevrolet. There’s no better 
time than now to make a 
change for the better!!

NEW

All new 1991 Suburbans and Full 
Size Blazers now have a $2500.00 
rebate. Come in now for our best 
deals ever on these units!!!

Also, S/10 Pickups & 4 door S/10 
Blazers have up to $1,000.00 re­
bate and as low as 1.9% financing.

Rebates Assigned To Dealer.
Low Interest Available To Qualified Buyers.

Call Collect 817-629-2676. Open M onday-Frlday 8 a.m. till 6 p.m
Closed Saturday And Sunday

FREE PROSTATE 
SCREENINGS

June 21, July 19 & August 16
2 to 5 p.m. •

Harris Methodist Erath County 
Hospital Community Room.

Sponsoredby Harris Methodist 
Erath County Hospital, Stephenville.

Call for appointment 
817-965-1599.

Dr. A.T. Deshmukh M.D., Board Certified 
Urologist, will be conducting the screens.

A member of the Harris 
Methodist Health System.

PURINA
D EA LER

f a r m  &
301N. Seaman Qfy

V

301 N. Seaman 
Eastland, Texas 76448 

(817) 629-2173 or 629-8035
<po

BULK FERTILIZER
Liquid Or Dry

Herbicides - Insecticides 
CUSTOM APPLICATION 

with Foam Marker

“Special Needs” is a 
support group for parents 
that have children with 
disabilities. The children 
can be any age and with 
any disability ,(m ental 
and/or physical). Some 
people believe the group 
is for parents of younger 
children bu t we have 
parents that have chil­
dren th a t are young 
adults, and hope to reach 
parents that have chil­
dren that are older since 
we need their experiences 
to help other parents.

The purpose of the 
group is to provide infor­
mation and support. Rais­
ing a child with a disabil­
ity is a lot like riding a 
roller coaster, there are a 
lot of ups and downs and 
you’re never quite sure 
w hat’s coming next. 
Though we can’t change 
the ride- having a support 
group can help with the 
ups and downs ofthe ride, 
by listening, sharing and 
understanding.

We hope to reach every­
one in the area and though 
some can not attend the 
meetings, we want them

Use The Classifieds

to know that our group is 
here and they can call on 
any group member if they 
need someone to talk to.

I will be sending letters 
to area physicians, agen­
cies and groups dealing 
with people th a t have 
disabilities, telling them 
of our group and hope they 
will pass on the informa­
tion to families that might 
be looking or needing 
support.

The group meets on the 
second Tuesday of the 
month at 7:00 p.m. at the 
T U Reddy Room. There 
are no regular meetings 
for June, July or August 
but we plan on having a
“Mom Luncheon” in July 
and a “Family Social” in 
August.

If you have or know of 
someone that has a child 
or family member with a 
disability that would like 
to come to our meetings or 
be on our mailing list, 
please feel free to call me 
and anyone who is inter­
ested is welcome to the 
meetings.

Thank you ,
Pam Tomsky 
Chairperson 

“SPECIAL NEEDS” 
629-1239

C JC  T o S p o n s o r  
B o y s  B a sk e tb a U  
C a m p  J u ly  15-18

Cisco Junior College is 
offering a Boys Basket 
ball Camp July 15-18 in 
the CJC Gymnasium. The 
camp is open to all boys 
ages 8-18. DougGalyean, 
men’s basketball coach at 
CJC, is the camp director. 
He will be assisted by 
Ronnie Hearne, women’s 
basketball coach at CJC, 
and Charles Hearne, boy’s 
basketball coach a t 
Graford High School.

Camp hours are from 9 
a.m. to 4 p.m. each day. 
Cost for attending is $60 
and includes a noon meal 
each day in the CJC cafe­
teria, a camp T-shirt, in­
surance, and awards. The 
primary emphasis of the 
boy’s basketball camp is 
on improving individual
fundamental skills and 
team play.

For a camp application 
or more information, con­
tac t Doug Galyean a t 
(817) 442-2567 or (817) 
442-4222.

-■
Cisco Press - Eastland
Telegram - Ranger
Times 0 ,Sunday,

June 30,1991
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Hwy. 80 East " As Fast As Fresh Can Be" Eastland

Dark

$2.85
Chicken Dinner.r «• u- * .»• » 4 v % :»>»

2 Pieces Chicken & Mashed Potatoes or 
Fries, Slaw, 2 Hot Puffs or rolls & Honey

White

$3.25

Specials good Saturday thru Friday, June 29-July 12
Open 7 days a week 11 a.m. - 9 p.m.

■ JS11  
___  • \

For Faster Service At Our Drive thru Window

Call 629-8981
A C C O R D IN G  
TO  TH E
A M E R IC A N  CAN CER 
S O C IE T Y , O N E O U T  
O E TEN  W O M E N  W ILL 
D EV ELO P  B R E A S T CANCER 
S O M E T IM E  IN HER LIFE 
T IM E . I I  IS  C U R R E N TLY  
E S T IM A T E D  TH A T O VER 3 7 ,0 0 0  
W O M E N  DIE EACH YEAR A S  A 
R E S U LT O F  B R E A S T CAN CER .
N IN E T Y  P ER CEN T 0 E  B R E A S T C A N C ER S 
ARE D IA G N O S E D  B Y  W O M E N t f R  THEIR 
P H Y S IC IA N S  R & N G  A ^ P J N T H E  
B R E A S T. w M n  W H O f J O I A G N O S E D  
W I T H U O m A R G E f B f f l t f H  TO  FEEL HAVE

Breast Cancer 
Detection Unit 
Available to Area 
Women.

Monday, July 1 
Eastland Memorial Hospital 

304 So. Daugherty 
Easlland, Texas

A 5
W O M A IT W H O  
CAN CER  B Y  
CA N  BE FE LT 
S U R V IV A

T F D W f f l T S U R V I V A L  R A TE. A 
I0 S E D  A S  H A V IN G  BREAS 

iRAPHY, B EFO R E A  LU M P  
9 7 %  FIVE YEAR 
A  9 0 %  TEN YEAR 

E. THE C O S T  IS  O N LY

Accredited By
The American College of Radiology

IG R AM  CAN D E TE C T A  CAN CER 
T l B S M A L l ,  •  EVEN  BEFORE 
IT CA N  BE F E L T.

V u
Cjtfdft

Can 6 2 9 - 2 6 0 1  for appointm ent
M E  R VISA

P̂ imChdiwrvzmi
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Fishing Outdoors
by T erry  L. W ilson

n  1 I 1 i I I I I I 1 I i i i i i
Free Admission To 

State Parks For 
Military Personnel

Last cast I gave you a 
proposed list of lakes for 
the 1992 Honey Hole 
Northwest Team Circuit. 
Lake Brown wood should 
have been omitted and 
replaced with 0. H. Ivie 
(Stacey) for the final 
event. I apologize for the 
error. Of course these 
lakes have not been final­
ized yet.

Anglers Choice North­
west Team Circuit will 
also be in our area next 
year with a few changes. 
With two straight years 
of tough fishing at Lake 
Spence, regional director 
John Smith of Brownwood 
has stated his lake will be 
dropped. Possible substi­
tutions are Stamford, 
Graham, Granbury, and

0. H. Ivie (Stacey).
This circuit has 2 events 

left for the 1991 year, Leon 
Ju ly  28 and Lake 
Brownwood August 11. 
The 1991 Classic will be 
held a t Lake Texoma 
October 2-6, 1991. And 
will feature over 
$ 100,000.00 in boats, cash 
and sponsor prizes for the 
teams qualifying.

After the Twin Buttes 
event we have four area 
teamsin thetop 15;James 
Fullen and B. J. Johnson, 
Bob Moore and Joe Bob 
Moore, Chuck Burgess 
and Tom Maynard, and 
Bobby Maynard and Terry 
Wilson.

The Eastland County 
Bass Club has set its 16th 
Annual Open Bass Tour- 
namentup for September 
15, 1991. Headquarters 
will once again be at

Chock-O-Block, this in the 
state furnished boat ramp 
at the bridge. Entry fee 
this year will be $35.00 
with an optional $5.00 big 
bass pot.

Guaranteed moniesare: 
ls t-$  1,250.00, 2nd- 
$500.00,3rd $300.00,4th- 
$200.00,5th-$ 150.00, and
lucky 16th-$100.00. 6th- 
15th and 17th-20th will 
be cash and/or merchan­
dise. Junior monies will 
be: lst-$  175.00, 2nd- 
$100.00,3rd-$50.00. Jun­
ior entry will be free this 
year for all Jr. entrants 
fishing with a paid con­
testant.

Sunday,, August 4,1991 
at Richland-Chambers 
Reservior the Texas As­
sociation of Bass Clubs 
will hold its final qualify­
ing tournament for its 
championship tou rna­
ment trail.

Anglers who place in the 
top 20 of this or one of the 
five previous events will 
qualify for the 
“Champion”Ship event to

MAYNARD REAL ESTATE
629-8568 Maynard Building, Hwy 80 East, Eastland, Texas

WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS!! Available Nights and Weekends

w i t ©

EASTLAND HOMES AND LOTS
$ 2 ,5 0 0  for tw o  SO' x 140* lot w ith  trees C en tra lly  located .
$ 5 ,0 0 0  for tw o tots m tow n. Lots have been  d o a re d .
$4 .SOO C om m erc ia l lot 70' x 9 4 \
S t0 .000 C om m erc ia l tow n lot 70* x 110* w ith  20* x 28 ' m eta l bu ild ing  

and 2(7 x 1? a ttached  v o h id e  port. C oncre te  floor.
$10,000 Four h ills ide  res id en tia l lo ts in e x d u s iv e  location.
$9 8 .SOO 3 BR, 1 1/2 B a th . C H /A . T r ie n d s h p "  m ob ile  hom e on 2 

acres of In te rs ta te  20  fron tage . P lus  a  50 x 70 MetaJ B u ild ing  w ith  
20* x 70* a ttached m eta l shed  on side. C ity  w ate r. E xceptiona l 
com m erc ia l location.

$120,000 C om m erc ia l p ro p e rly  o fl In te rsta te  20. 5 0  x 100* M etal 
bu ild ing  w ith  pa rtition  N. to  S. th rough  bu ild ing . M akes tw o  offices 
or tw o liv ing quarte rs. A pprox 5 .000  sq. ft. C R /A . O n 38 693 acres. 
P oss ib lo  ow nor finance .

$5 ,000 2  BR . 1 B a th , fra m e  hom e on sh a d y  lot. W ill se ll in "as is" 
cond ition  M ay bo  used for com m erc ia l o r res identia l ventu re .

Sfi.000 3 BR. t Bath on good c ity  lot. V e ry little  needod to  m ake a
realty cu to  hom o

$ 8 ,0 0 0  3 BR. t B. on  la rgo  sh ad ed  lot. A  grea t va lue  in a livab le  hom e.
$10,000 3 BR. 1 Bath. Iram o hom o w ith  sid ing. On spac ious , shady 

and tota lly fenced lot. C H /A  w ith  heat pum p.
$12,500 Two cen tra lly  located hom es on tw o  ad jo in ing  lots. N eeds 

w ork for g roa t investm en t po ss ib ilities  as hom es or ren ta l prop.
$10,500 2 BR . 2 Bath “A rtc ra fT  m ob ile  hom e on 3 be au tifu lly  land- 

scapod lots. C H /A . D ishw asher, range, lots of cab ine t sp ace  and 
separa te  utility area. N ew  ca rpe t and  cu s to m  drapes G a rd en  tub- 
m m astor ba th . B ack deck of redw ood w ith  w h ite  guard  fad ing. 
R odw ood p layhouse  and 12  ̂ x 12" sandbox for ch ild ren 's  p lay.

$20,000 2BR . 1 Bath, fram e w ith  s id ing. Fenced! yard , lo ts of pecan 
and fruit tre e s . S ing le  car garage. V e ry  la rge  and new  metaJ bu ild ing  
bohm d house, not v is ib le  fro m  fron t view . Back of m e ta l bu ild ing  has 
b»g m etal doors w ith  e lec tric  opener lo r  m u ftp le  veh ic les, exiting 
and ontering from  a lley fo r to ta l p rivacy,

$25,000 2 B R . 1 Bath hom e on  2  b ig . be au tifu l lo ts. G ood roo f, secu re

LAKE LEON HOMES AND LOTS
$7 4 ,4 00 -3  BR . 2 Bath , newty bu ilt, s tunn ing  b rick  hom e on deodod 

lake  fro n tag e  lot. C H /A . firep lace , rich ca rp e ting  th rou gh ou t, 
eno rm ous m aste r ba th  w ith  jacuzzL Largo ba lcony w ith  hot tub . 
ove rlook ing  a to ta lly  priva te  v ie w  of the lake and w oods.

$6 5 ,4 00 -3  BR . 2  Bath. Tota l e lectric . B eau tifu l and  un ique lake hom e 
on  125' x 3 5 0  leased lo t. B u ilt-ins. range, oven and d ishw ashe r. C a ­
the d ra l ce iling , large, spac ious room s w ith  w a lk -in  d o se ts . N ew  
ca rpe t and firep lace . T w o s to rage bu ild ings , sta ff m eter and lake 
pum p. A p rico t, cherry , and m any o ther fru it and na tive  trees. 
P ossto le  ow ner finance .

$63 ,0 00 -2  BR . 1 Bath , fram e m eta l w ith  w ood hom e, overlook ing  
lake, on deeded  lot. C H /A . Sate lrte. large s to rage house. C eiling  
*ans th roughout, b reakfast ba r w ith  cu s to m  cha irs, in te rio r is done 
In m aster c ra fts m a n s h p  of cons truc tion , plunrtoing. and w iring . A ll 
bu ilt- ins  w ith  superio r design.

$45.000-N ew fy rem ode led  Lake hom e w ith  new  root, w iring , plunrto- 
ing and sid ing. C H /A . 3-ton ground  unit. A ll e lectric  in underg round 
condu its . TotaJ e lectric . L igh ted  w a lkw ay over w a te r to  ligh ted boat- 
do ck  p la tfo rm  w ith  p ic n ic  tab le . 12  x 12* w ell house /w orkshop  w ith  
o rga n ize r she lves and com partm en ts . E xce llen t insu la tion . G uard 
ligh ts su rround  hom e and beau tifu l law n on large, deeded  lot.

$40 ,000-4  BR. 2  Bath H om e bu ilt-m ob ile  hom e of approx. 1600 sq. 
ft. C H /A , ca rpo rt. 2  s to rage  bu ild ings w ith  w orkbench  and o rga n iz ­
ers. G uard  ligh ts , fron t, and back. La rge cem ent pa t© , T .V . Sate llite . 
Tota l e lec tric  and energy e ffic ien t. Irriga tion  sys tem  fo r lawn and 
fru it trees p lu s  g rape  v ineyard . K itchen has bu ilt-ins, d ishw asher, 
b reakfas t bar. sepa ra te  d in ing area , la rge  w indow s and custom  
drapes. W ood bu rn ing  s tove  w ith  w in te r's  supp ly  of cord w ood.

$5 5 ,0 00 -2  BR. 2  Bath m ob ile  hom e on tw o  la rge  deeded  lots w ith  
huge  shade  trees. H om e has b ig . insu la ted , g lassed-in  sunroom  
and great lake fron tage  on deep  w ate r. 565' cha in  link fence 
su rrounds hom e. C oncre te  boat dock hook-ups. C om es com p le te ly  
fu rn ished w ith  qua lity  fu rn ish ings , inc lud ing : new  carpot. drapes, 
ce iling  fans, new  re frige ra tor, w ashe r/d rye r, bu ilt-ins. all fu rn ish ings 
in liv ing room , sun room , d in ing  room , and bed room s. T.V . S ate llite , 
S taff M eter and 250  ga llon bu tan e  tank. A love ly  hom e.

$3 0 ,0 00 -2  BR . 1 Bath hom e on deeded lot. La rge k itchen. P um p 
house  w ith  pum p

$ 2 3 .0 0 0 -Tw o deeded  lo ts on  p rim e  lake fron tage  n e a r l^one C edar 
C ou n try  C lub . Sm all boa t dock, deep w ater.

house S creonod in Iron) porch  2  doub le  car ga rages, each has ns W.OOO-Deeded w ate rfron t lake lo ts on lake  Iron tage . P riva te  and
ow n s to rago bu ild ing /w o rkshop  a tlachod  

f;*8.000 3 BR. 2 Bath hom o in good ne ighborhood . C H /A . woll- 
inr.uLitod. s to rm  w indow s, n il now  p lum b ing  and w iring . C ustom  
rir.iiM»s and m in i b linds. 5 ce iling  Ians, k itchen w ith  bu ilt-ins. Large 
utility room , w a lk  in e b s o ts . good sto rago  house Big concre te  pa tio  
and  g ,is  Bar B O ue grill.

$;*.1.?>00 2  BR . 1 Bath Iram o wuh s id ing. C om p le te ly  rem odeled 
m to ro r Now carpot. Buift-m  ovon and coun ter top  range S uperio r 
insu la tion  m w a lls  and ceding N ow  p lum bing and w iring  D ouble 
ca rport. La rgo pa tio

$30,000 4 BR . 2 Bath hom o.exco llen t loca tion . B eau tifu l and o u t­
s tand ing  m aster b e d ro o m  H om e w ith  lan ta s t©  va lue  at this price .

$58,000 Just ba re ly  in tow n, like  new. 4 BR . 2  1/2 B a ih . fram e w ith  
sid ing hom o C H /A . ene rgy e ffic ien t. Located on 6 *  acres of lushfy 
w oodod terra in . B eau tifu lly  e ffic ien t, b w  m am tam ance hom e.

$60,000 3 BR. 2  Bath, fram e w ith  s id ing hom e on 1 1/4 acres. Built- 
in. C H  A. sw im m ing  poo l, gam e room  U nique and e n e rg y -e tfc © n t 
hom o located across street from  golf course  

$65,000 4 BR. 1 large ba th , hom e w ith  firep lace . Tw o la rge  concre te  
lva tos 7 m ins. Irom  E astland  School bus stops at property. Sm alt. 40  acres-$600  0 0  per acre . F enced, hand dug w ell, na tive  pecan

w ooded area.
$ 4 .500-Tw o lake front b ts  al $4 ,500. oach.
$78 .000-B ig . B eau tifu l 4 BR Lake H om e done  in rough cedar. 

A pprox. 2000  sq. ft. w ith  2 car ca rpo rt. S kyligh ts , ca thedra l ce ilings 
and ce iling  fans. 2  a ir cond ition ing  system s fo r ene rgy e ffic iency in 
th is to ta l e le c tro  hom e. W et bar. ind irect ligh ting , m irro red  w a ll and 
c losets . T.V. S a te llite , bu ilt-in  d ishw ashe r, com pactor, w ine  rack, 
coun te r top  range w /se lf-cb a n in g  oven. Jenn -A ir co o k  e la n d . Spa- 
e b u s  bed room s and c lose ts . O u ts tand ing  firep lace . S taff M eter and 
boa t dock on approx. 150* x 175* deeded lot. V e ry im pross ive  hom e.

LAND. FARMS. RANCHES 
AND SMALL ACREAGE

$8 ,00 0 -5 .5  acres w ith  sm a ll tan k  surrounded by w illow s. A ccess to  
O lden  w ate r. P oss ib le  ow ner finance .

$12 ,5 00 -15  acres. C leared land In be au tifu l lo c a ib n , 15 m in. from  
E astland . E xc. acreage  upon w h ich  to  bu ild . D eep ta n k o n  property .

4 0  acres $425 .00  pe r acre. S. of C arbon. F enced. 1/8 m inera l rights 
to  buyer. G ood hunting . W ill co ns id e r ow n e r finance.

6  room  hom o on p rop e rty  m ay be used lo r  renta l or guest hom e. 
Both  hom es located on 23 acres w ith  w ate r w e ll and deep  lank. O nly 
utility p a d  is o lo c in c  A verages less than  $100 .00  pe r m onth. 

$65,000 A BR. 1 1 2  Bath. Two sto ry , fo rm a l and e legant hom e w ith  
I urofx»an touches Rod tile  roof w ith  s tucco  and w ood exterior. 
ln i> o ried  fix tu res, exqu is ite  w a llpaper, appo in tm en ts  and ch a n d e ­
liers Irom  Spam  and Italy. A tru ly  lav ish hom e, g rea tly  underp riced . 
I oca tod  on 3 largo b ts .  th is hom e has e n e rgy  e ffic ien t C H /A . attic 
fan. excoss ivo  insu la tion  and s to rm  w indow s. S epara te  A/C stud© .

trees. 1 m eta l shed , 1 cross fence . 1/2 m ine ra l rights to  buyer, w ith  
leasing nghts. P ossto le  ow ner finance.

33  21 acres $2000  00  per acre . 2 .000 pecan  trees in exce llen t 
p roduc tive  cond ition . Buned ‘ by  w a ir  irnga t© n  system . 7  lines. A ll 
m inera l rights go.

80 a a o s -$ 6 0 0  00  per acre 15 m inutes east of E astland . 1 tank. 
Exce llen t hunting , and fish ing.

52  acres $ 6 00  00 per acre . G o od  hunting and fish ing . 20 m inutes 
from  Eastland

guost house, or o ffice  bu ild ing  loca ted  at b a ck  of p roperty . Trees m 50.6 acros $600 00  pe r acre . G orgeous land. C reek  runs th rough
abundance, sto rago house, fish pond, and m uch m ore 

$ /4 .8 0 0  3 BR . 2 Bath, b r c k  hom e in exc lus ive  d iv is ion  of E astiand . 
Horne is o n o rgy  e ffic ien t w ith  C H /A . B eau tifu lly  done  in w a llpape r 
and decora to r touches k itchen bar and buitt-ins. F ron t and back 
pa t© s w ith  p rivacy fences. La rgo room s, ce iling  fans, doub le  car 
garage  w ith  o lectnc door openers.

$85,000 38 R . 2 Bath, large b re k  hom e w ith  ca the d ra l co iling . E xce l­
lent 1 oca to n  m shady and quiet ne ighborhood  La rge, beau tifu l 
gam e and sun ro o m  Tw o car ga rage  w ith  e lec tric  door openers, 
f o rm a l Irving ro o m  firep lace , and bu ilt-in  desks, bookshe lves and 
cabm ots m don and Irving area. S to rage  house. Tru ly b v e ly  and 

. rperlec t co nd ition ’  hom o.
$86,500 3 BR. 2 Bath. B rick hom e. G a rden  ba th  and  m irro red  d o se ts  

and ba th room s add a d ram a tic  touch to this ex trem e ly  un ique 
house. CH  A. energy e lfic© n t. F an tas tic  w o t-ba r w ith  aw n ing and

heav ily  w ooded property. D eer, tu rkey, qua il and dove  abound. 50 
to GO m atu re  pecan trees G ood set of pens and s to rago bu ild ing.

120 acres $595  an acre . 2 stocked tanks. 1/8 m inera l rights to  buyer. 
P ossto le  ow ner finance w ith  20 -25%  dow n. 3 o ilg a s  w ells on 
p rope rty  earn approx. $300 .00 to  $400 .00 per m onth. P oss ib le  3 o ff­
set w ells to be d r ilb d . C reek runs th rough  p roperty .

166 acres $550  00  an acre . N ear Eastland Lake C an be d iv ided  in to 
40  o r 80 acre tracts. G ood fences, barn  and pens.

220  acres see under Eastland hom es $180,000.
242  acres-see under Eastland ho m es-$165,000.
24 9 .3  acres $425  per acre. S abanna R iver runs th rough  p roperty . 2 

d e e p ta n k s  stocked w ith  Bass and C hanne l Cat. P e rfec t hunting  lo ­
ca ting. P oss ib le  ow ner fin an ce  w ith  20%  dow n and 10%  Int. H eavy 
oH p roduction  fo rm erly  on p roperty . P roperty  cove red  heav ily  w ith  
fabu lous m atu re  pecan trees,

luxurious decora to r touches th roughout th is  hom e. Rock firep lace  167 ac res-$454 .00  per acre. G ood hunting and p rod uc t© n  land just 
and beam ed coiling . AJI k itchen app liances burft-in. w ith  Jenn- Air is- w est of C isco .
land range and b reakfast bar. Large, prrva ie  lot m ve ry  e x d u s iv e  80 acres $500  00  an acre  w ith  access to  e lec tric ity  and c ity  w ater.
part of E astland.

$96,000 3 BR. 2 Bath  huge bnck hom e on 7 .25 acres. N ew  and 
dom inating  coun try  hom e bu ilt on h igh h ill, overlook ing  lake, h ig h ­
w ays and hills, fa /, fa / be low  B u ilt-in  com pacto r, m c ro w a ve . tiled 
breakfast is land in k itchen w ith  bu ilt-in  ran g e  B ircri cab ine ts  and 
w oodw ork . M assive  rock fi/e p lace  w ith  heat-o -la to r. B u ilt-in  b o o k ­
she lves. room -to -room  in te rcom  system  w ith  au d ©  contro l. Jacuzz i 
in m aster ba th . S ate llite  d ish w ith  con tro ls  and ou ts ide  speakers. 
D ouble car garage  w ith  e lec tric  openers . T ree  house fo r ch ild ren 's  
p lay. H eavily w ooded, pnva te  and serene.

$ 120 .000-3  BR . 2  Bath. ‘ P ic lu /e  P e rle c i"  b rick  hom e on 10 acres. C H / 
A. doub le  ca r ga rage  w ith  e lec tric  openers, firep lace , w h ite  m etal 
railing for fence su rrounds property. O utbu ild ings and corra ls  in 
exce llent cond ition .

$150,000-4 BR. 2 Bath , tw o  sto ry b rick  hom e on  9 acres in p rim e 
locat© n. S epara te  den. d in ing  and liv ing a re a s . F irep lace w ith  heat- 
o-la tor. doub lo  car ga rage  w ith  e le d n c  openers. M uH p le  sky  lights.

H and dug w ell and large, sp ring -fed  tank. 10 x 12 M eta l bu ild ing  on 
property . Land pa rtia lly  cu ltiva ted .

$8 9 ,5 00 -3  BR. 3 Bath. B nck coun try  hom e, five  m inutes from  do w n ­
tow n. Loca ted  on 6 acres, large hom e b  e legant, w ith  bu ilt-in  
m cro w a ve . se lf- c lean ing  ovens. Jenn-A ir cook is land and ce iling  
fans th roughout. La /ge  concre te  po rches, patio , and priva te , b rick- 
w a lled  garden  off m aster bedroom . F irep lace w ith  hoat-o -la to r. B ig. 
sunny ga rden  room . Beam ed and vau lted  ce ilings. Built-in  b o o k ­
she lves and cabm ots. W alk-in  d o s e ts  w ith  bu ilt-in  o rgan ize rs . 
C ab le  T.V. hook-ups in every room . G arden ligh ts, e lectric  garage  
d o o r lifts on 3 ca / garage. W ork shop, barns and m eta l corra ls . Fruit 
trees, oak. pecan  and pine. Irrigation system  fo r trees and ga rden . 
C H /A . superior m s u la tcn  and energy e ffic ien t hom e. P e rfec t c o n ­
d ition .

$36 .000-5  BR . 3 Bath  hom e. F ram e w ith  s d in g  Tw o sto ry  hom o w ith  
a lm ost 1 acre  of land in tow n. Has been rem odeled ins ide and new 
roof added. C H /A . f p.. ou tdoor gas grill. Spac. and charm ing home,

wet bar. T.V . sa te llite , la rge  ba /n . A pe rfe c tly  be au tifu l "coun try" $25 ,000-3  BR. 1 B b re k  hom e CH/A. good locat© n. In oxc. cond. 
loca t© n c lose  to  tow n. $3 ,000 -28  lots on 5 acres. Tw o m obile hom e hook-ups. C ity  w ater.

$159,000-4 BR. 2  Bath , five  yea r o ld  bn ck  hom e on 122 acres. sew age and e lectric ity. C edar rail fencing  Ideal fo r mob. hom e lots. 
Located 8 m inutes from  E astland. Approx. 2000  sq . ft. C H /A .
separa te d in ing , u tility  room , to ta l e lectric . AJI land in coasta l be r- CARBON. CISCO, GORMAN. OLDEN
m uda. C ity  w a te r p lus dug w e ll and d e ep  tank. N ew  co rra ls  and C a /b o n -$ 2 .2 5 0 .1 BR . 1 Bath . K itchen and liv ing ro o m  Approx. 600 
fe n a n g . 1/2 m ine ra l righ ts go to  buyer. R ock bu ild ing  fo r ba m . sq. ft. hom e.

$165 ,000-3  BR. 2  B a th , approx 3000  sq. ft. hom e on  2 4 2  acres. C a rbo n -$15 .0 0 0 .3  BR . 1 Bath hom e on 2 lots w ith  trees and garden. 
Located 15 m ins, fro m  E astland . C H /A , sunken  den w ith  ca thedra l A sm all, com fortab le  hom e in good repair, 
ce iling . N ew . bu ilt-in  app liances in k itchen . 3 car ca rport, g a /a g e  C a rb o n -$ 3 .5 0 0 .2  la rge  lots. Three la rgo  paean troos on front of lots, 
and w orkshop . B arns and pens. C orra ls  and ho rse  sta lls. C re e k  Fenced on th ree  sides. H ook-ups ava ilab le  for an c ity  utilities, 
runs th rough  property. 6  a c re  lake  s tocked  w th  bass and channe l C«sco-$5.000. B rick and tile  bu ild ing, com m erc ia lly  located. Approx.
ca l. P rim e  hunting  acreage  

$180 ,000-3  BR. 2  Bath . B rick  and s id ing hom e w kh  aoprox. 2600 sq. 
ft. C H /A . N a tive  pecans and co as ta l g rass. B rin e  h & Loon river 
runs th rough  th e  ou ts tand ing  p roperty . A pprox . */4  r v o v d  rights 
go  w ith  p roperty . C ity  w a te r. F ive m inu tes fro m  G a iT and . H om e Is 
loca ted  on 220  p rim e  a re a  acres.

25 ' x 50 \  C en tra l air. P oss ib le  ow ner finance.
C isco -$10 ,700-3  BR . 2 Bath, Approx 25 0 0 sq . ft. h o m e o n  11 /2  acres.

H ook-ups fo r tw o  m ob ile  hom es on back of proporty.
C isco -$39 ,500-3  BR 1 3/4 Bath. C H /A . fenced yard, s to rage bu ild ing, 

ga rage  w ith  e lec tric  door opener. U tility  room , b roakfas t a rea  off 
k itchen , la rge  fivfng ro o m

$3 07 .000 -Lavish and enorm ous 2  s to ry  rock houso. trim m ed In rough C isco -$ 5 4 ,0 0 0 -co m m e rd a l bu ild ing  w ith  res idence In rear, (3B R. 2 1 /  
cedar on  200 acres. H igh ly  en ergy-e ffic ien t w ith  C H /A . s to rm  2 B a ih ). 175* h ighw ay fro n u g e .
w indow s and extra  Insu la tion . P o lished w oo d  and  sifc w a llpa pe r G orm an-$7P .000-3  BR. 2 Bath , B rick hom e on 10 acres. C H /A . 
touches th rou gh ou t hom e. M aster ba th  has 5' x 5* shew er and doub le  car ga rage . T.V. S ate llite , tota l e lectric. S torage house. Any 
separa te  ba th  w ith  Jacuzzi. K itchen has bu ilt-in  d ishw asher, pom - m inera l rights ow ned go to  buyer.
pact or and d isposa l. B reakfas t ba r. C e iling  fan s  and rheostat G o rm a n-$  197.000-3 BR . 3 Bath . B ig. be au tifu l B rick hom e on 51
ligh ting  th roughou t. T.V. SaleHke. Land is cu ltiva ted , has o il p roduc 
to n  and  tw o  fiv e  acre  tanks. T h re e  exce lle n t b a m s, metaJ corra ls 
and pens. A ll m inera l righ ts , o il p rod uc tio n  and  Incom e on  170 acres 
go  to  buyer. U nd erg rou nd  sp rink le r sys tem s. 3 weds and d ty  w ater.

$ 3 17.000-*S how p!ace" hom e on  100 a c re s  o f "co un try  c lub " property. 
3 BR . each  w ith  a  p riva te  ba th . S e pa ra te  o ffice . K itchen  w ith  bu ilt-

acres. C H /A , b u il- ln s , u tility  ro o m  3 pan tries , sew ing room , fire  
p lace . Krtchen ba r w ith  a ll new  cook top . doub lo  ovens, trash  
com pacto r, d ishw a she r and w a te r so ftner. P a tio  w ith  Bar-B -O ue. 
sw im m ing  poo l w ith  au tom atic  contro ls  4 separa te  horse lo ts w ith  
cove red  sta lls, ca ttle  c row d ing  pen and squeeze chute . Tw o horse 
s ta rting  ga les . MetaJ shed and 10 stafl bam

in  Ice m aker, w ine  rack, doub le , s e l-d e a n ln g  oven s. Jenn-A lr. O lden $38 ,500-3  BR . 1 Bath, com p le te ly  rem odo lod  hom o on 4 b ig
B lender, etc. on "pop-up", ho m e  ce n te r, co un te r contro ls . R evo lv­
ing k itchen she lves w ith  organ ize rs . Room -Jo-room , bu lk -in  vacu um  
system , and  ca b le  T .V . hook-ups in e ve ry  room . C lose ts  w ith  bu ilt- 
in o rgan ize rs  and shoe  sto rage. H uge m aste r ba th  w ith  p riva te  
patio . "M atch ing* 15 ' x 3 0  s to ra g e  house. A l  e le c tric  underg round 
condu tts i G rea t fo n d n g . P ro fess ion a lly  deco ra ted  and landscaped.

ELIZABETH MAYNARD 
ASSOCIATE 

559-2318

lots. C H /A . D ishw asher ceHIng fans, la rge  u tility  room , new  carpet, 
liv ing room  has ca thedra l ce lling  and firep lace . N ew  roof, p lum bing 
and w iring . R edw ood deck w ith  tree  In the  center, great B ar-B  Q uo 
g r il.  P roperty  In d u d e s  sm a ll e ffic iency, guest o r ren ta l hom e. 

O ld e n -$9.600-2  large BR. 1 ba th  on 4 lots. T w o  bu ild ings, house has 
n ice screened porch.

w DEBRA MAYNARD
R G * n o S w L ^ HEAT ASSOCIATE

BROKER 629 1013

be held September 28-29.
First place is guaran­

teed a fully rigged cham­
pion boat, a $20,000.00 
value. For more informa­
tion you may call Ken 
Knott at (903) 872-5002.

The Texas Parks and 
Wildlife D epartm ent 
wants to say thank you to 
the troops who partici­
pated in Operation Des­
ert Storm. As part of the 
Capitol Salute to Texas 
Troops, the entrance fees 
at state parks will be 
waived from June 29-July 
4 for military personnel.

“We know that many 
military personnel are 
back at home now and 
gladtobe with theirfami- 
lies,” said TPWD Execu­
tive Director Andy San­
son.

“We wanted to say 
thank you in a very spe­
cial wav bv civinu mili-

CTAM I To H o ld  
M e e tin g  J u ly  2

The next meeting of the 
(CTAMI) Central Texas 
Alliance for the Mentally 
111 is Tuesday, July 2, 
1991, at 7:00 p.m. at the 
F irst B aptist Church, 
Brownwood. The speaker 
will be J. Don Wright, a 
therapist from Abilene.

Read The
County
Classifieds

Cisco Press -Eastland 
Telegram - Ranger
Times sunday,

June 30,1991

tary families the chance 
to spend some time to­
gether in one of our beau­
tiful state parks.”

Governor Ann Richards 
has organized a huge sa­
lute to Texas Troops for 
June 29-July 4. The sa­
lute includes a parade and 
fireworks display in 
Austin on June 29 and 
June 30.

The TPWD offer will be 
valid at all state parks 
that charge an entrance 
fee. Military personnel 
will need to show their 
military ID in order to 
have the fee waived.

m 
, Legals

Eastland Independent 
School District is accept- 
ingbidson Cafeteria Prod­
ucts, and Maintenance & 
Custodian Supplies for 
the 1991-92 school year. 
Bid specifications may be 
obtained by contacting the 
following: Cafeteria Prod­
ucts — Barbara Rogers, 
cafe supervisor, (817)629- 
8927; M aintenance & 
Custodial Supplies - Doug 
Crutchfield, maint super­
visor (817)629-8221.

Deadline for receiving

Seven big reasons 
to invest with 

Edward D. Jones & Co.
1. U.S. Governm ent Guaranteed Bonds. 8.49% *

< iii .it .in ti ' <1 .i*. Im iinii-lv | u \  nii 'i it  n |  |ii int .u n i  ii iIi m -.I

2. Federal Ineom e Tax-Free
Municipal Bonds. 7.00% *

1111 • -I <-vl 111,1V Itf'MlItjiN I 1(1 Kl.lli* illl'l l'» . 11 1.IM-S

3. Investm ent tirade Corporate Bonds. 9.83% *
4. Federally Insured .

C ertificates o f  D eposit. 8.05% *-5 yr.
t IK;i\ ,iil:il»lc fmin iiiviilulmiis ii.iimiivv nlr Issiid mini iii.iti«»ii ;i\;ul.il»l«*«»ii 
11 * 111 r *st Sul ip * l in ;i\ .ill. tl nl ii v M.iv I*’ m i I i|m  ll»» mien *1 |*n.ill\ frii r;nl\ 
V\illnli:m;il 1_______Itiiiiiiililin’ Alliui.il la irn l  siiii|ilc iiilnrsi

5. Insured Federal Income Tkx-Froe 
Municipal Bonds.

In li i i ’*.l in ; i\  l* *M ih jr»  I In  • . l . i lr  .H id l« ■ .il l . i v  s

G. IKAsand Ret irement Plans.
ILis*11 mm A m i n i  t *<n |«»r,ili' l ln iu ls

7 .

7.00% *

9.37% *

C a l l  o r  ( I m p  b y  f o r  

m o r e  i n f o r m a l  i o n  o n  

h o w  t o  l a k e  a d v a n l a g (  

R o b e r t  L .  S t e e d  o f  t o d a y s  h i t ' l l  y i e l d

107 W . Main invosiiiicnls 
Eastland, Texas 76448 ,m < ' ‘

(817)629-3851

* Ifc ilr  c\|»r**s m *iI a s y i r l c l  In  m a l m  i l y  a s  o f  6/20/91
l In  a v a i la b i l i t  y .  M a i  k d  risk  is a m u s i c l < 'm l i n n  m t  

i n v c s l i n r n l s s o l d  p r i o r  I n  m a l m  ii v

!3  E d w ard  D. J o n es  & Co.
IlMt Vivl Sw n  I ' lrv

Barbara Love, Inc. 
Broker
629-1725

Tou)*t &  Country
REAL ESTATE

317 East Main 
Eastland, Texas 76448

629-8391

Moving to Eastland County? Or 
anywhere in U.S.A. Call Toll Free 
1-800-525-8910 Ext. 4365 for 
information. (No Rentals Please)

EASTLAND:
CRESTWOOD home reduced! 3 BR, 2 Bath, built-ins, 
Sauna room. E36
BUDGET STRETCHER! Under $10,000.00! Nice 
Neighborhood. El
PRICE HAS BEEN LOWERED! 3 BR 1 1/2 baih brick 
on comer lo t ONLY $39,900.00. E8 
BEAUTIFUL HOME! 3 BR. 2 baih. formal living 
room, large den. In nice subdivision. E12 
AIRPORT ACRES 3 BR, 2 1/2 baih brick, remodelled, 
large living area. Large lot, irccs. E l3 
VACANT LOT - commercial area, near downtown. 
Owner will finance. E30
NEWLYWEDS! 2 BR, 1 baih frame home in ncal 
neighborhood. Under S I0,000.00. E15 
GREATNEIGHBORHOODforgrowing family. 3 BR, 
2 baih brick, F/P, drapes, buill-ins. Gameroom/sun- 
room. A well kepi home. E l7 
CRESTWOOD ADDITION, 3 BR. 2 baih brick home. 
F/P, CH/CA, buill-ins. Lovely home. E20 
NEWLY REMODELLED 3 BR. 2 baih frame home. 
CH/CA, new siding. Won’t Iasi long al this Price! 
S25.000. E3
EARLY 1900*S HOME: 11/2 Siory frame home on 
large loi in desirable loealion, needs restoration. 9 
rooms, 2 baihs. E4
AFFORDABLE! Below $10,000.00! 2 BR. 1 bath
frame home on large, fenced lol. Needs some interior
work, greal for handyman! E2
MANY EXTRAS! 2 BR, 1 baih frame home, fireplace,
CH/CA. Fenced yard, irccs! E26
BEAUTIFUL tree w*ih 4 BR, 1 bath
frame homc.formal
PRETTY LOT, ■ n ’f'n v ah iliiics; Iar8c 3 BR, 1 baih 
frame home. E 6 K U b & aJI
EASY TO BUY, greal lerms! 3 BR, 1-3/4 baih, CH/CA, 
brick Sc frame house on comer lot. E5

. OTHER
NEAR LAKE LEON: Nice dbl. wide 3 BR. 2 baih, 
buill-ins, CH/CA, on 1/4 acre w/ lake view, irccs.029 
RANGER: S3,900.00 for 2 BR frame home. 028 
RANGER: Nice 12 vr. old3 BR, 2 baih brick, F/P, buill- 
ins. Shaded comer loi. 05
RANGER: Beautiful home! 3 BR, 2 baih brick home; 
kilchcn buill-ins, workshop. 09 
RANGER: 3 BR, 1 1/2 baih brick home in excellent 
neighborhood. CH/CA, kit. buill-ins. Price reduced, 
under S30.000.00. 04
RANGER: Large 3 BR, 1 baih frame, shaded lot; extra 
lol across sirccl, gar., CP, RV cover. 06 
CISCO: Comfortable 3 BR frame.Kilchcn appliances. 
Fenced rear yard; fruit Sc pecan trees. 02 
CARBON: Shaded comer loi with frame home. Owner 
financing w/approved credit. 011 
LAKE CISC6 

iiio. S6,0d
•: Large rc s id cem W erg h  mobile home hook­

ups. 012 B i l U
GSCO: Approx. 5 ac., good for commercial or residen­
tial. Financing available. 013
CISCO: Rock hom cj»w j«ta«cm odcllcd. only blocks 
from school and dovH l!iaU fl5  
GORMAN: Numerous listings, .S8,000-S45,000. Call 
for details.
LAKE LEON: Lake cabin on deeded lol, Staff meter, 
fruit irccs and lake froniage. 016 
PICTURESQUE PR1VATY! Nearly new 3 BR. 2 baih 
brick home on large, completely fenced lol. Well for 
oulsidc use. Many olher amenities. 018 
LAKE LEON: 2 BR, 2 baih home on 3 waterfront lots. 
CH/CA, satellite. Guest house, sig., fruit/pccan trees, 
garden spot. 024
LAKE LEON: Be ready for summer! Weekend cabin on 
waterfront lot. Heal A/C. Furnished. 026 
DESDEMONA AREA: 3 BR, 2 baih older frame with 
outbuildings on 3/4 ac. Possible owner financing! 025 
CAN’T BEAT THIS! 2BR, 1 bath frame house; perfect 
for handyman. Financing available. 027 
RANGER: 2 for 1!! 2 BR, 1 baih frame home and 1 BR, 
1 hath home on a large lol. Excellent investment prop­
erty or live in one & rent one. 023

HOUSE & ACREAGE:
NEAR LAKE LEON -2B R , 1 1/2 bath mobile home on

DREAM COME TRUE home in the country, minutes 
from town! Beautifully decorated 3 BR, 2 bath brick, 
many amenities; workshop. HA1 
CARBON: 3 BR frame home on 36.5 acres. Cultiva­
tion with quota; minerals. 11A24 
100 ACRE PECAN ORCHARD. Highly productive; 
2 homes, farm cquipmcnt;23 ac. w/dnp irrigation. 
Good Income! HA9
EASTLAND LAKE: Great fishing! 5 acres with 3 BR, 
1-3/4 bath home. City water and satellite. HA 13 
COUNTRY CHARM on 10 acres. Beautiful oak trees 
surround this brick 3 BR, 2 bath with CH/CA. HA16 
RANGER: 2 acres with 3BR, 2 bath modular home. 
Pretty setting, trees. Owner fin. toqual. buyer. HA 15

ACREAGE:
LAKE LEON: Excellent recreation or building site! 4 
acres, highway and lake frontage. Al 
NIMROD: 139 acres native pasture. Hwy. & county 
road fronlaec. Nice building site. Some minerals, pro­
ducing well. A 16
29 ACRES within city limits of Cisco. Highway front­
age, oak trees. A 10
Iw O  BUILDING SITES: Approx. 3 acres each, with 
water meters. Highway frontage. A5 Sc A6 
CARBON Area; 118.5 acres, fenced Sc cross-fenced, 3 
tanks Sc equipment shed. Some minerals. A19

• a P P
coastal. 2 tanks, fenced Sc cross-fcnccd. Sex
224 AC

cquipmi 
. SO. OF CARBON: Part brush, approx. 3 0 ac.

omc miner-

SOLD Addn. I BR frame cabin,

als. A20
320 AC., CARBON: Improved grass Sc cull. Fenced Sc 
cross-fcnccd, 5 tanks. Some minerals. A21 
16 ACRES on pavement near Eastland. Fenced, beau­
tiful oak trees. Be Quick! Al 1 
296 ACRES North of Cisco - Native pasture with 
highway & county road frontage. 3 tanks; good hunt­
ing. A26
59.5 ACRES, Highway 80 E., Ranger, across from 
school. Native pasture, great for subdivision! A12 
155 ACRES 5x>. of Gsco; cultivation, pasture & 
wooded, with dccr. Highway frontage. A l/
61.8 ACRES so. of Ranger, with paved Sc county road 
frontage. Producing oil Sc gas; 1/4 minerals. AI5 
9 ACRES in the city limits! Nice building site. A31 
65 ACRES E. of Carbon: approx. 21 ac. cull.; paved 
road. Sandy land; some minerals. A7 
160 ACRES NW of Eastland: Approx. 90 acres of 
improved grasses, remainder native pasture with scat­
tered trees; 2 tanks. A9
327 ACRES W. of Carbon: 75 ac. cull., improved 
grasses & wooded pasture, peanut quota. A 13 
o2 ACRES NW of Gorman: Approx. 1/2 cult. Small 
lank, hand due wells. Minerals. A 14 
245 ACRES S. of Carbon: Approx. 67 acres in cult., 
balance in improved grasses, underground irrigation, 
large bam w/shed. 12 x70’mobile home on property. 
M inerals Sc quota. A8 
OLDEN: 16 Ac.
TV antenna, city

COMMERCIAL:
EXCELLENT LOCATION! Store with 1680 sq. ft., 
kilchcn,CH/CA; 5 tlr. spaces w/all utilities. C7 
FANTASTIC LOCATION next to Skinny’s. 14’x24l

i •!
S O L D

rfiomc hookup, carport,

office bldg.; 60x160 paved Sc fenced lot. Cl 
ON THE oQUARE: 2 story bldg, in good location, 
some equip. & boc Jis. Needs some repairs. C4
CISCO: Excellent office bldg., 5 rooms, 2 restrooms. 
Concrete parking area. In good location. C5 
CISCO, 1*20: 30 wooded acres, over 500 ft. Frontage 
on North Access Rd.# east of city limits. C6 
RANGER: 2 story bldg., needs repairs. 1 st floor open 
area w/restroom Sc kitchen. C8 
1-20, 25 ACRES, I mile from E. Eastland exit. Beau­
tiful homesile, permanent Sc overnight trailer spaces. 
Some minerals Sc production. C9 
CISCO: Beauty snop, 4 station, 8 hairdryers; nice 
interior. Asphalt parkine. CIO 
CISCO: Frame office bldg.; 3 offices, reception area. 
On comer lot. C12
CISCO: Vacant lot, E. 8th Sc Avc. C. C l3 
CISCO: Mini-mall, over 4,000 sq. ft. metal bldg, on 
main thoroughfare. Cl4
CISCO: L arflM m M rtJg .; concrete floor, office in 
front; 30x5 0 K U L L A « 5  
IN V E ST O R S!^ unit apartment complex, 1,2&3 BR, 
D/W,washcr/drycrcon.,CH/CA;90%occupancy.C18 
FANTASTIC LOCATION! Hwy. 80 E. Eastland, 
near 1-20; high volume of traffic. Currently occupied 
as offices. Excellent for retail Sc expansion. C2 
RANGER: Large garage type building divided in 2 
units, plus a small apartment. C21 
RANGER:

5 acres, Staff water, new cellar. Stove & refng. HA2 
EXECUTIVE HOM1 
rated. Show place. H SOLD s. Beautifully deco

COUNTRY CHARM I 3 BR brick on 2.7 acres. Bay 
windows, F/P; decorator touches. HA 12 
OLDEN: 1 1/2 -56 ac.; 3 BR, 1 1/2 baths.
In need of s o m i^ 1'* " ^ ^

in;
2 stotyjjrick bldg.; 18 offices, reception,

r
I

t .  frontage;
RANGER: 2 story bldg, in downtown Ranger. Great

,fy n -  .
with large 3BR 1 f/2 bath apartment Good condition 
& near downtown. C22
EASTLAND: Commercial Id , approx. 1 ac., Hwy. 80 
E. frontage; high traffic volume. C23

location! Good condition! C24 
EASTLAND: Two 2-unit townhouscs. Frame w/brick 
trim, CH/CA & appliances. Great investment! C25

bids is July 17,1991. Bids 
should be m ailed to 
Eastland ISD, 900 W. 
Plummer, P.O. Box 31, 
E astland , TX 76448. 
‘Cafeteria Products Bid’ 
or ‘Maint/Cust Supplies 
Bid’ should be clearly vis­
ible on outside of enve­

lope. Eastland ISD re­
serves the right to accept 
or reject any or all bids.

4 (6-23, 6-27, 6-30, 7-4)

Use The 
Classifieds

KAY BAILEY 
REAL ESTATE

P.O. BOX 693 - EASTLAND, TEXAS 76448 
R.G. (Buck! Wheat, Broker 
629-2365 629-8514

Eastland Homes
Exclusive Subdivision, Custom 3 BR, 1 3/4 Btth, Brick, Approx. 2,300 sq. ft., Wooded 

Lot, AJI The Amenities including Rock Poe pi see, Wet Bar, Cathedral Ceiling, braolited 
Master, Super Kitchen w/Center Island, Formal Dining. Game room, A More! $98,500.

D ream  Home, Nearly New 3 BR, 217 Bath, Brick, near Lake Leon, situated on 8.65 ac.. 
Professionally Decorated, Gorgeous Wallpaper, plush Carpet. Massive Master Suite, Formal 
Dining. Unique Livtnq Rm. w/lots of Glass A Spiral Staircase to loft $1 20,000 .

LOVELY 4 BR, 2 3/4 Bath, Formal Livinq A Dining. Fantastic kitchen, scp. Breakfast 
Rm.. Family Rm. w/Bookshelves, Parquet FloarVArca Rugs, Carpel in BR's, Wonderful 
Bsckyard, huqc Oak Trees, Privacy Fence, Patiaa; A Rare Opportunity to own one of the 
outstanding S. Seaman St. Homes. $123,000.

OW NER TRA N SFERRED , Ccmfcrtablc 3 BR. 2 Bath, Builtm Bookahelves A 
Fireplace in Livmq Rm., Formal Dining w/Beautiful Crystal Chandelier, Breakfast Nook off 
Kitchen, 1 juqc Bedrooms, Ceil in q Fans A Miniblinds throuqhout. Trees, $34,000.

V ktorlan  Style, 3 BR (Could be 4), Professionally Decorated far that *UghtBrightM 
feeling, from the cheerful Yellow Exterior to the beautiful wallpaper injide. M odem Kitchen, 
Formal Dining. Utility, l^rgc Comer Lot, $68,500.

C ountry  Living in town, 3 BR, 21/2 Bath, Brick I lome surrounded by huge Post Oaks on 
9 J  ac., fenced A cross fenced, tep. dining. Spacious Open Livinq Area, Wood burning Healer,
1 auge Master Suite, Oversized Utility. Pretty Patio built around troej, $53,000.

Seller Finance, Nice 3 Bedroom, 1 3/4 Bath, Frame w/Siding, comer lot, large living/ 
dining cumbo, breakfast nook in kitchen, lots of trees A shrubs, A chance to live in tn  extra 
nice nciqhborhood at a budget price, complete w/CHAA, $29,000.

Cute A Cozy 2 BR situated on 4 Beautiful lots w /lou of Big Trees, Fireplace, Carpet, 
Builtins, Sun Room could double for 3rd BR. Small Equity A Possible Aisumpliun. 529,400.

Still Miss The Farm? This Roomy 3 BR, 1 3/4 Bath Frame Hume has 1.5 ac. including 
Shed, Pens. A Tank, and you still h ive all the convenicces of Town. Huge Master BR, All 
Kinds of Cloact A Storage Space, Wood burning Heater. Pretty Patio, Fenced, $35,000.

Possible Assumption, 3 BR, 2 Bath, Frame w/Sidmg. Carpet, Builtina, C11/A, Fenced 
Backyard, Formal Dining, Detached Garage, Comer LoC, Attic Space, Too Cheap at $27,000

Spraw ling 3 BR, 1 3/4 Bath, Frame/Sidmg on oversized comer lot, carpet, custom 
drapes, formal dining, big country kilchcn w/breakfast area, large master BR/sitting rm., 
utility, detiched two-story bldg, for office, hubby, or mother-in-law, $59,900.

Popular Area .Extra nice 3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick, Carpet. Bufltins, CH/A, Formal Living/ 
Dining, Den, Gameroom, Fireplace. Privacy Fence, Storage Shed, RV Parking. Curbed Flower 
Beds, Selling below purchase price, $85,000.

Unique Rock Home. Complete w/new carpet, wallpaper, Q (/A , Electrical A  Plumbing 
Lines, features six large comfortable rooms, 3 fireplaces, builtins, utility rm., A  concrete 
picnic table. Even the Roof is new! 539,500.

Quiet Street, Comer lx*, A Good Neighbors come w/thw large 2 BR, 2 Bath, Mobile 
I lome, carpet, Cl l/A, builtins, washer A dryer, storaac shed, attached carport, $19,500.

Golfers, Ib is  3 BR, 2 Bath, Doublewide I lome situated cn 1 ac. faces the Gulf Course! 
Carpet, Builtins, CH/A, Fireplace, Utility Rm., Deck, $27,500.

Ideal Investment, This 3 BR Home stays rented. Big rooms, Formal Dining Rm., Roof 
has been patched, but pneed accordingly, $16,000.

Executive Home, 3 BR, 3 Btlh, log/S tone/Glass, on 3.77 wooded ac.. Open Living 
Design w/Massive Rock Fireplace covering one wall. Magnificent Kitchen w/aD the gadgets. 
Office, Utility. Covered porch all across back, $160,000.

EASTLAND AREA HQMES& LAKE LEQN
Custom  Built Bnck Home. Approx. 1,860 sq. ft., situated on approx. 1 ac. completely 

fenced, 3 BR, 1 3/4 Bath, Fireplace, Builtins, Q  VA. New Carpet, Utility, 2-Car Garage, 
Covered Patio, star, bldgs., pens, garden. One of the nicest homes in Olden! $63,900.

It's  Sum m er time, and the livaig is easy. Pretty 3 BR, 2 Bath. Brick, like-New Condition 
Throughout, carpet, drapes. Cl l/A, Fireplace, Builtins. stained Glass, Patio, 2-Car Garage, 
large comer lot. Eastland SchotJs, Carbon. $52,000.

Ilorse Lovers Take Note!Ncal as a Pin 2 BR Mobile Home in Olden, approx. 3/4 ac. 
complete w/fenced area, shed A pens for ’Trigger” , cool central air inside, $19,500.

A tlentlon Mobile I lome Owners. Beautiful Wooded Acreage to put your home on.
Approx. 3/4 ac., hookupd already there, $7,800.

Ijike  Leon, Really Nioe 2 RR. 2 Bath Mobile Home, 14* x 8(7, Screened Porch all across 
lake side, G  l/A, situated on 2 Deeded Ixxs, Pipe-Rail Fence, Boat Dock w/Elcctric lift. Deep 
Water, Private Location, Price Reduced! $35,000.

Lake Leon, l^uge 2 BR, Brick I Lane, Deeded lot, SlafT Meter, Cl l/A, Fireplace, Big 
Open living RiVKitchcn, Fenced Yard, Waterfront, Reduced far Quick Sale! $40,000.

I^ k e  Leon, New 3 Bedroom, 2 Bath, Brick Home, Carpet, Builtins, Fireplace, G l/A , 
Jacuzzi, Redwood Deck w/1 lot Tub. Deeded Lot, Staff Meter, $72^00.

Lake Leon, Waterfront lots. Deeded, $6,000 A up. Also have several lots in town $2,500 
to $10,000.

COMMI'.RCIAL PROPERTIES & ACREA6E
Excellent Com m ercial lot an Hwy. 80 East, Eastland, approx. 180r x 20(7, City Utilities 

Available. $30,000.
'1-20 Near Hwy. 6, 18(7 x 150f lot. Reduced fur Quick Sale, $17,000. Just West o f popular 

re&aurani and service iu t im . f ‘ 1
•"•Hunters Paradise, 252 ac. out in t f  TBoor^es”, Takes a rugged vehicle just to get to 

it. Very isulated. $400 po rac . IU* an  old. hOUL.cc it mTaixlygaDd shape. , J
166 acn Near Eastland, Good Access, Fair Fences, Mostly wooded A pasture, some 

cultivation, could set o f pens, could be divided, $550 per ac.
We Also have several other tracts o f land including two 6.5 ac. places, 24 ac., 40 ac., 402 

ac., 42 ac., 49 ac., 56 ac., and will have further details in next ad.
Com m ercial acreage, approx. 50 ac., off Hwy. 80 E., Eastland. Prime location far future 

development. Please call for details.
W ash A Dry la u n d ro m a t, Eastland’s newest laundry facility, llw y. 80 E. location. High 

Traffic location. Stays Busy! $90,000.
t s

We Offer Complete Property M anagement Services. If you’re 
tired of the hassle of taking care of rental property, Call Us’
WE APPRECIATE TH E OPPORTUNITY TO  SERVE YOU. WE 
SPECIA LIZE IN “AFTER FIVE” AND W EEKEND SHOW- 
INGS.

m
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ANN WILLIAMS 
REAL ESTATE
610 Conrad Hilton Ave., Cisco

442-1880
Business & Home Phone 

CISCO HOMES
[Reduced to $9,800. - 2BR home plus detached apt., many 

trees, corner property.
|\Vho Says You Can’t Afford A Home? Numerous 2 and 3BR 

homes under $12,000., some with owmer financing. 
[Attention Men! Very nice large insulated shop, large rollup 

doors, many extras, 4 lots, neat 2BR mobile home.
[Only $15,000., neat and clean 3BR home surrounded by oak 

trees, shop, storage bldg., fenced yard.
It’s Your’s For Only $19,500. - Neat 3BR home, w-ood heater, 

carport, covered patio, fenced yard, by Elem. School. 
[Garden Lovers! 2BR brick energy effec. home, CH/CA, city 

and well water, large trees, 5 lots.
Handyman’s Special, historical 2 story home with basement, 

shop, large privacy fenced yard.
[Need extra lots? Perfect for growing family, 3BR, 2 baths, 

large rooms, 6 lots.
Bring All Offers! Spacious 3BR, 1 3/4 baths, central heat, 7 

closets, garage, storage, near Elem. School.
[What A Deal! 3BR, 2 bath newer home, CH/CA, 2 lots, 

possible FHA financing with $500. down, only $27,500. 
Family Delight-3BR, 1 1 Ji baths, CH/CA, vinyl siding, storm 

windows, covered deck, garage, carport, 2 lots, $29,500. 
Exceptional Price! Nice3BR, 13/4 bath, CH/CA,sep. LR,DR 

& den, extra storage, garage, fenced yard, $29,500.
|Just Listed, quiet neighborhood, large3BR,2 1/2 bath home, 

great den with fireplace, CH/CA, many extras, patio, car­
ports, shop.

Immaculate 3BR, 2 bath brick, 2 living, areas,office, CH/CA, 
fireplace, wood heater, patio, carport, nice fenced yard. 

Room To Ramble - Approx. 2700 sq.ft. 4BR, 21/2 baths, CH/ 
CA, 2 loLs, double carport & storage, assumable FHA loan. 

[Enjoy Swimming Year Round In your own Indoor heated 
pool! Large 4BR, 3 bath home, CH/CA, fireplace, garage, 
carport, extra storage, possible owner financing.

[Step Into Yesteryear, spacious 3BR, 2 bath Colonial Style, 
formal DR, woodheater in den, large oak trees, workshop. 

[A Rarity! 2storyspaciousColonial5BK,31/2 baths, 2 CH/CA 
unlts^ FP, many extras, garage, orchard, 3 fenced lots. 

[Don’t Cramp Your Style, Big N’ Beautiful 4BR, 3 bath, 2 
living areas, CH/CA, 2 fireplaces, surrounded bv oak trees. 

[Country Charmer, city conveniences, beautiful 4BR, 2 baths, 
CH/CA, super swimming pool, large shop, garage, city and 
well water, many extras, approx. 1 acre.

VACANT LOTS - Many to choose from, call for information.

BARBARA LOVE 
647-1397

CINDYE FOSTER 
629-8227

SHELLY RICIIEY 
629-3614

ROSEMARY FERGUSON 
653-2375

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY
Unbelievable! 4 lots with metal building, only $9,500.
Have your own Business - Warehouse or Office, excellent lo­

cation on Conrad Hilton Ave.
[Reduced to $69,000., large remodeled restaurant with equip­

ment and furniture, large parking lot, 1-20 frontage, on 
approx. 2 acres, price and terms negotiable.

SMALL AND LARGE ACREAGE
Reduced to $18,500., approx 5 acres with 2BR, 2 bath, CH/ 

CA, FP, garage, horse barn, tank, rural water.
[Cozy 2BR rock home, CH/CA, garage, approx. 1800 sq.ft.

shop, on 5 acres near Cisco, $J2.500.
60 acres, sandy loam, possible 8 3/4% Int. loan assumption, 

only $29,500.
|$350. per acre, approx. 209 acres, Just outside city limits, 

mostly wooded, several tanks, rural water nearby. 4.io«
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L  A

ES
161 ACRES Lots bottom 
land, 60 tillable, well 
fenced, 1/2 mile Sabanna, 
good deer hunting, lots 
big oak, pecans. $550 ac. 
Agent owned.
80.5 ACRES, 7 mi NE 
Rising Star, 30 Coastal, 
app. 1/2 cultivation, well 
fenced, lots road front­
age $560 per acre.
95.43 ACRES, 20 culti­
vated. 3-1 frame home, 4 
mi of Carbon, good barn, 
native grasses. $70,000, 
$14,000 down. 10% inter­
est.
62 ACRES m/1, about 1/2 
cult., good peanut/melon 
land, some coastal, lots 
road front, with new 
fence. $500 acre, liberal 
terms agent owned. 
iV  a ^RES 1 mi. E.Hwy 
36. timber, coastal 3 
watei taps applied ior, 
well fenced, barn, t r r ks, 
$500 acre, cash or equity/ 
Gl assumption.
182 ACRES Desdemona, 
most native pasture, roll­
ing, liveoak, deer, 2 BR 
frame home, FREE natu­
ral gas, barns, corrals, 
fine well, $600 Acre, 1/4 
down, LOTS pavement. 
54.35 ACRES E. Carbon, 
most all good coastal, 
near pavement, well 
fenced, good well, 1 tank, 
minerals, $750 Acre cash 
or (?) terms.
APP. 1.5 ACRE E. Car­
bon, 2 BR frame home, 
clean, big oaktrees, small 
barn, walls insulated, co­
op water meter, fruit/pe- 
cans, just off hwy. Just 
$20,000.
We WANT your listings 

35 Yrs. in Business 
COGBURN REALTY 

DE LEON 893-6666
893-5898 893-2642

RS105

FOR SALE: Two bed­
room, 1 bath house. Large 
fenced yard. $8,500. See 
at 315 N. Oak, Ranger. 
Call (817) 968-0322.

R52

3 BR, brick, fireplace, 
ceiling fans, CH/CA, cor­
ner lot and 1/2,1701 Ave. 
L, Cisco. $28,000. 442- 
4920.

C53• •

BRICK HOME FOR SALE: 
3 BRs, 2 baths, dining 
room, large family room, 
carpet, central heat and 
air, large backyard with 
chain link fence, redwood 
deck. Beautiful home. 
1108 Mancil Drive, Cisco, 
442-3837.

C53
• •

FOR SALE: 1 BR House, 
1402 S. Simmons St., 
Eastland. Call 629-2060.

T57

HOUSE FOR SALE: Oak 
Lawn Addition - Freshly 
painted, new wooden 
blinds, new valances, 3 
BR, 2 bath, large family 
room, wood burning fire­
place, 3 walk-in closets, 2 
storage buildings, large 
yard, wonderful view of 
Eastland. In the upper 
60’s. Call after 6:00 p.m. 
629-2127.

T104

FOR SALE: Two bed­
room, one bath house on 
large lot. Assume low 
monthly payments. Call 
915-625-4051.

C53

_A-----

HO M ES
A

houses on So. Seaman. 
One house - 3 BR, 2 bath. 
One house- total electric 
with kitchen appliances 
furnished. Must have ref­
erences and deposit. Call 
after 9:00 a.m. 629-3445.

T104

PALO PINTO lake water 
front, 2 bedroom, 2 bath 
with wood burning fire­
place and fishing pond. 
42,000. Weekends-817- 
769-3926; Weekdays-817- 
540-1361.

T59

2 Bedroom house for 
SALE or RENT on 1/2 acre 
just outside city limits of 
Cisco. Call 442-4043 or 
442-4413.

C104

FOR RENT
NICE 3 BR, 2 bath, brick 
duplex, built-ins, garage 
and privacy fence. Close 
to schools. $75,000. Call 
817-629-8474.

T52

EASTLAND - 3 Bdrm, 1 
extra large, spacious liv­
ing area, yard with pecan 
and fruittrees, inside city 
limits. 214-341-8833.

T52

FOR RENT: 2 BR mobile 
home, appliances fur­
nished. Carport, refriger­
ated air. 629-2943 day or 
653-2021 night, leave 
message.

T104

APARTMENTFORRENT: 
Sabine Terrace Apts, 1,2 
& 3 Bedroom apartments, 
nice neighborhood. Con­
veniently located near 
schools, 629-2518. All 
bills paid. Equal housing 
opportunity. 600 W. Sa- 
dosa.

T104

FOR RENT: 2 bdrm de­
luxe apts., appliances, 
fenced back yard, extra 
storage, $210 per month. 
Call Ron Butler Sr. at 647- 
3234 or 647-3511 after 
5:00 p.m.

R104

FOR RENT: We have a 
wide range of apartments 
and houses. One to fit 
every need. Furnished or 
unfurnished by the week 
or month. Call and ask for 
Darlene or DeeAnn first 
for clean modern living 
and low, low prices. 629- 
2805 or 629-2851.

T104

NOW AVAILABLE! Fur­
nished and unfurnished 
1 AND 2 bedroom; like 
new; carpet and drapes; 
frig, dishwasher, range 
and disposal; water, trash 
pickupand TV cable paid. 
Choice neighborhood. 
See and compare Royal 
Oaks Apartments, 1304 
Royal Lane, Cisco, 442- 
3232.

C104

FOR RENT: 1 bed and 2 
bed, 2 bath apartments. 
Ma or appliance, 
earthtone carpets, pool, 
located behind Pizza Inn. 
Eastland’s newest and 
finest. Call Shirley 629- 
3164.

T104

FOR RENT

COLONY II APART­
MENTS One and two 
bedroom. Furnished and 
unfurnished. Move in 
now!! Designer deco­
rated, energy efficient 
with modern appliances, 
central H/A, Laundry, 
large play area. Conven­
iently located near 
schools, churches, shop­
ping. Resident mgr. 
Family living at its best, 
in a quiet neighborhood! 
500 Sadosa, 629-1473, 
Equal Housing Opportu­
nity.

T104

FOR RENT: No deposit 
with utilities paid. 3 or 2 
bedroom mobile home. 
R efrigerator, stove, 
washer, dryer furnished. 
Sunshine Valley. Leona 
Morton, 442-1365.

C104

ATTENTION: If you are 
looking for a clean and 
attractive newly remod­
eled apartment at a rea- 
sonabe rate try Flamingo 
Apartments in Cisco. 
Fully furnished kitchen­
ettes. All bills paid. Start­
ing at $45 per week. Must 
see to appreciate. Call 
442-9902 or 629-2805.

T104

MAVERICK APTS. 1,2 & 3 
BR with W/D hookups. 
Basic TV cable and free 
HBO.CIosetoall Eastland 
schools. Call Diana at 
629-1913 for details.

T104

FOR RENT: Unfurnished 
2 BR house, large fenced 
yard, plus storage build­
ing. Available after June 
10. $175. month. $100 
security deposit. 629- 
1205.

T104

FOR RENT: 4 BR, house 
in Eastland. Good neigh­
borhood. Built in appli- 
ances.914S. Bassett. Call 
629-3377 or 629-2682.

T104

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom, 1 
bath, trailer house. Ref­
erence required. 653- 
2407.

T104

FOR RENT: Two Bed­
room unfurnished house, 
recently remodeled. Also 
small three room house, 
applicances furnished, 
recently remodeled. 
Good location. Call 915- 
893-4717.

C104

HELP
W ANTED

HELP WANTED: Be an 
equal partner with Avon 
and earn up to 50%. Avon 
representatives are 
needed in Cisco, 
Eastland, Ranger, Car­
bon, Gorman, De Leon 
and Rising Star. Call 
Dorothy Guenther, Assis­
tant District Manager, 
(817) 442-1578.

C56

NEED Nurses Aides. Must 
take 80-hour training 
course to be on registry; 
we will train. Salary $4.65 
after successfully com­
pleting course. Russell 
Gray, Rising Star Nurs­
ing Center 817/643-2691.

RS104

S u n d a y , J u n e  3 0 ,1 9 9 1

NEEDED RN Relief Sat. & 
Sun. Hours 6-2 or 2-10.

petitive. Con- 
Gray, Rising

Salary com 
tact Russel
Star Nursing Center 817/ 
643-6700.

RS104

NURSES AIDE NEEDED 
Prefer certified but will 
train, benefits available. 
Apply in person. 1405 W. 
Commerce, Eastland.

T104

NURSES NEEDED 
All shifts part-time and 
full time. Good working 
conditions and competi­
tive salary. Many bene­
fits. Apply in person. 1405 
W. Commerce.

T104

HELP WANTED: If you are 
a registered nurse and 
interested in working at a 
nursing facility with good 
working conditions and 
competitive pay. Apply in 
person at Western Manor, 
460 W. Main, Ranger.

R104

HELP WANTED: RN for 
weekend work. More 
hours can be given if nec­
essary. Apply in person 
Canterbury Villa, Cisco, 
442-4202.

C104

HELP WANTED: Nurses 
Aides, all shifts. Apply in 
person at Canterbury 
Villa, Cisco, 442-4202.

C104

RN DIRECTOR 
OF NURSES 

102 Bed nursing facility 
is accepting applications 
for RN Director, 5 days a 
week and weekend cov­
erage. Salary is negoit- 
able, many benefits, va­
cation, health and dental 
insurance, stock plan, re­
tirement. If interested in 
long term care, please 
contact Peggy Pryor for 
appointment. 629-1779. 
EOE.

T104

HELP WANTED: 50% 
share for local home tele­
phone sales. Every local 
home a prospect. Give 
name, address and tele­
phone number in letter 
only to Sales, Box 29, 
Eastland, 76448. Ideal for 
mothers at home, part- 
time, clubs, organiza­
tions, etc. for fund rais­
ing. Representatives wel­
come in Clyde, Cross 
Plains, Brownwood, 
Putnam, Strawn, Mingus, 
Gordon, Moran, Gorman, 
Olden, Desdemona and 
Carbon.

T104

HELP WANTED: 25%  
share self-starting, imagi­
native representatives to 
assist local firms increase 
sales and help stimulate 
area’s economic growth 
through consistant, traf­
fic-building occasions 
and events. Honesty and 
enthusiasm are great 
assets. Send name, ad­
dress, telephone and 
brief qualifications to 
Sales, Box 29, Eastland, 
TX 76448. Representa­
tives welcome in Clyde, 
Cross Plains,
Brownwood, Putnam, 
Strawn, Mingus, Gordon, 
Moran, Gorman, Olden, 
Desdemona and Carbon.

T104

fo ""* | HELP ^
J W A N TE DJ

NOW HIRING NURSES 
AIDES - Will train. Apply 
in person, 460 W. Main, 
Ranger.

R104

Now taking applications 
at Northview Develop­
ment Center for program 
assistant. Come by 401 
W. Moss, Eastland. EOE.

T104

H O U S E K E E P E R  
WANTED apply in person 
at Econo Lodge, 2001 I- 
20 West, Eastland.

T53

NEEDED
Someone to care for eld­
erly lady in her home. 
Daytime, evenings, or 
overnight. Would con­
sider live in. Must be reli­
able and kind. Call 629- 
1028 or 629-3624 for an 
interview. References 
preferred.

T53

RN (full-tim e position 
available immediately) for 
RN and process home 
setting in Eastland, 2 
years recent nursing ex­
perience required. Use 
professional judgment 
and apply superior docu­
mentation skills, excel­
lent benefit plan. Mileage 
paid. Call 817-629-1268. 
Girling Health Care, Inc. 
EOE.

T53/  /  *- *r’ . , , \ .

How would you like to 
have your own business? 
You can send for this in­
formation at Shara Lee, 
P. O. Box 161130, Ft. 
Worth,TX76161.For only 
$9.95.

R53

SERVICES
LAWNMOWERS 

Overhauled. Small en­
gines repaired. Pick up 
and deliver in Eastland. 
Walt, 105 S. Mulberry or 
call 629-3237.

T104

UP TO $17,500.00 low 
interest home remodeling 
loans to Texas Vets. Call 
(817) 734-2755 to apply. 
Clark Const., Inc.-Gor- 
man. VA approved lend­
ers for Erath, Comanche 
and Eastland Counties.

T104

YARDWORKWANTEDIN 
CISCO: Mowing, edging, 
trim shrubs, light haul­
ing. Also repair lawn 
mowers, edgers& tillers. 
Call 442-2004.

T104

HOUSE CLEANING - 
Vacuum, mop, wax, dust, 
clean bathrooms or just 
straighten. Call 639-2545.

T53

CENTER POINT ENTER­
PRISES INC: Free Esti­
mates. Builders & Devel­
opers, Metal Buildings, & 
Remodeling. Joe Mayn­
ard, 629-8568, or 629- 
1013.

T104

FARM SERVICES 
Fences built or repaired, 
tractor shredding by hour 
or acre. Free estimates. 
Days 647-3571, Nights 
647-1036.

T61

& SER VIC ES FOR SALE

HELPING HAND 
SPECIAL

Gardens tilled. Lawns 
mowed. Garages cleaned 
out. Haul off junk. Clean 
up. Fixup. Anything, rea­
sonable. Gil-629-3237.

T104

BARNES 
CONSTRUCTION 

New construction & re­
model, sheetrock, tape & 
bed.
Free estimates.
Days 647-3571, Nights 
647-1036.

T61

Hay hauled on weekends. 
Call Carl Bray. 442-1447.

C104

I will shread lots. Call 
Tommie Simmons 442- 
1729.

C56

FOR SALE: Beautiful 3 
BR, 2B, 1CG Townhouse 
located on golf course in 
the cool mountains of 
Ruidoso NM. Offered by 
owner at price 10% below 
current appraisal. Please 
call RC Wheeler 629-1541 
orwriteto507Crestwood, 
Eastland, TX 76448.

T55

LemonTree Boutique has 
2 beautiful wedding  
dresses, sizes 8 and 10 to 
rent or sell at cost.

C52

FOR SALE: Snare drum 
and bells, electronic cash 
register, intercom. Call 
647-1048 after 5:00.

R58

FURNITURE FOR SALE: 
New - Port-a-crib, trundle 
bed, tables, bookcases, 
shelves, lamps, dinette-4 
chair, wall accessories, 
bed frames, bunkie sets. 
Also Used - Honda Elite 
50, under 600 mi. Dining 
table, waterbed and bunk 
bed, cedar chests. Call 
Dolan Parker 629-2763.

T104

FOR SALE: Quality busi­
ness and/or personal 
cards. Orderatthis news­
paper office.

T104

BOOKS FOR SALE at 
Eastland Telegram. 1/2 
price, different varieties.

T104

CARBON TRADING 
POST

Quality used and new 
furniture and sizes reno­
vated mattress sets and 
frames at affordable  
prices. Master Card and 
Visa accepted. Hwy 6, 
Carbon, blue building at 
flashing light. Webuyand 
sell used furniture and ap­
pliances. 817-639-2216.

T104

W.J.N. ENTERPRISES 
Ready-made and custom 
designed stationery  
items. Wide variety of col­
ors, styles, and graphics 
printed on standard  
weight computer paper. 
Also consulting services. 
For more information, call 
Justin at 629-8932 or 
come by 307 N. Ammer- 
man.

T57

FAMOUSCOPYRIGHTED 
Stop-Smoking for Good 
Personal Letter sent di­
rect to you or to a loved 
one. It’s working forthou- 
sands. $5. (total). Write 
Sm oking, Box 29, 
Eastland, TX 76448. 
__________________T104

VALUABLE, HISTORIC 
Tapestry Paintings in this 
area? All over Southwest. 
Booktells story and what 
to look for. $17.00 (total). 
Write Paintings, Box 29, 
Eastland, TX 76448.

T104

REMEMBER WHAT 
AMERICA DID in the 
Middle East! Get a large 
“Middle East Crisis” wall 
map today at 1/2 price at 
the Eastland Telegram.

T104

FOR SALE: Freestone 
peaches. $10 bushel. 8 
miles south of Cisco on 
Rising Star highway. FM 
Road 2526 2/10 mile. 442- 
2070.

C53

RIPE TOMATOES for 
Relish or Canning - Call 
639-2545, Pat Caraway.

T59

AUTO S
FOR SALE: 1986 Dodge 1 
Ton, 30,00 miles asking 
$7500.647-5384.

T53

FOR SALE: 82 Ford Fair­
mont, 6 cyl, auto, A/C, 
runs good. Good work 
car. $625.00. OBO. 442- 
4360.

C53

FOR SALE: Plymouth 
Satellite Custom, 52,000 
original miles, excellent 
condition. Call 629-1686.

T52

FOR SALE: ’81 Camaro 
350, auto, power and air, 
$2100. 629-3645.

T53

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 
1988 Yugo, low mileage, 
standard with air. Will 
trade for two good, grown 
horses or self contained 
travel trailer. 442-3055 
after 4:00 weekdays all 
day weekends.

C55

M O BILES

WHOLESALE SALE
2 + 2 Island range, front 
kitchen only $180.00 per 
month.
3 + 2 Double wide (as is) 
$10,000.00 cash.
4 + 2 Double wide 
$31,900.00, delivered with 
air.
Call A rt’s Homes in 
Granbury for your best 
housing values. 1-800- 
621-7196 or 817-326-2392.

T53

G ARAG E
SALES

GARAGE SALE: July 5th- 
6th, 8:00-5:00. 907 Fox 
Hollow, Eastland. Large 
oak teacher’s desk, nice 
student desk, upright 
piano, full size bed and 
mattresses, clothes, bed­
spreads, toys, misc.

T53

;i G A R A G E  
S A LE S

GARAGE SALE: Saturday 
June 29,8:00 to 5:00,808 
Ramsey, Cisco (Brecken- 
ridge Hwy across from 
tank company one block) 
mens and womens  
clothes, new hand made 
crafts, books, self-feed­
ing pig feeder, & much 
more.

C52

MOVING SALE: Thurs­
day, June 27,8  a.m. thru 
Saturday, June 29.409 E.
10th, Cisco.

C52

GARAGE SALE: Clothing 
and household items. 
Saturday, June 29, 8:00 
until 5:00. No sales be­
fore 8:00 a.m. 1205 West 
14th St.

C52

MULTY FAMILY YARD 
SALE: In Ranger, on 
Breckenridge Hwy. Lots 
kids clothes, plants, 
books, toys and lots of 
misc. Friday and Satur­
day.

R52

YARD SALE: Tues., July 
2, 8-5:30, 309 E. Wilson, 
Eastland. Lots of good 
clothes, books, misc., 
house goods, 1972 in­
vader outboard boat w/ 
115 Evanrude motor.

T52

GARAGE SALE: 201 S. 
Oaklawn, 8:00 to 5:00. 
Saturday, June 29. 
Clothes-children’s size 5 
to 10, teen to adult some 
baby and toddler sizes, 
baseball cards, stereo 
equipment, sewing ma­
chine, books, jewelry, 
makeup, dishes, lots of 
toys, and many misc. 
items.

T52

2 FAMILY YARD SALE: 
601 Elm Street, Ranger. 
Fri., & Sat. June 28 & 29, 
Jr., Misses, and Men’s 
clothes. Craft and other 
items.

R52

YARD SALE: Sat., June 
29, 8 a.m. till 5 p.m., 919 
Blackwell Rd. Box 
springs and mattress, 
chairs, end-table, base­
ball cards, Avon prod­
ucts, dishes, clothes and 
knic-knacs.

R52

YARD SALE: Saturday, 
June29,8a.m.-dark,122  
Pecan, Ranger. Ladies 
Western suits, formal 
dresses, clothes, furni­
ture, fishing tackle, 
wicker, cook books, lots 
of misc.

R52

ESTATE AND GARAGE 
SALE: Friday, and Satur­
day, June 28 & 29, 9:00 
a.m., repeat 9:00 a.m. 
until, 1101 West Main, 
Eastland.

T52

2 FAMILY GARAGE 
SALE: Sat., June 28, 9 
a.m. -4  p.m. Lots of Items 
- Boys clothes, upright 
antique Mason piano, 
some furniture, lots of 
misc., FM Road 3101 
(Eastland Lake Road) 11/
2 mi. Past lake, blue 
mobile home west side of 
road.

T52



t 1

y i
N O TIC E S

CARPORT SALE: Friday, 
July 5, Highway 183 South 
of Cisco. 8 a.m.-5 p.m. 
Needlepoint, toys, 
clothes, and misc. items. 
Watch for signs.

C53

ANTIQUES

FOR SALE: Antiqueglass 
and furniture and other 
collectibles. “We Buy 
Estates.” The House of 
Antiques, 908 S. Bassett, 
Eastland, Texas. Open 
every day.

T104

NOTICE: FUND RAISING 
for your church, club or 
organization can be easy 
and profitable, selling a 
local product at a good 
commission rate. If inter­
ested, describe your or­
ganization in a letter to 
LOCAL SALES, Box 29, 
Eastland, TX 76448, with 
name of person to con­
tact.

T104

The Home Shoppe, An­
tiques & Crafts, 545 East 
10th, Baird, (1 blk W. of 
Allsups), Open Friday, 
Sat., & Sun. 10 a.m .-5:30 
p.m. or call 893-4685 or 
854-1707. Consignments 
welcome.

T55

NOTICE: Chose a sub­
stantial FREE GIFT for 
simply agreeing to see a 
revolutionary dust-free 
cleaning system in your 
home. No obligation to 
buy. You set day and time. 
Write Clean, Box 29, 
Eastland 76448 with 
name, address and tele­
phone number, for ap­
pointment.

T104

NOTICES

NOTICE - 1 am no longer 
responsible for any debts 
other than my own as of 
June 5,1991.

Mike L. Cason
C57

OPENING JULY 1 
Patsy’s Creations, Corner 
of Old Putnam Rd and 
West Hwy 80 in Cisco. 
Hours: 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Mon.-Sat. Lots of crafts, 
and Mexico pottery.

C53

Statewide Classified V J  Advertising Network 
Advertise In 291 Texas newspapers for only $250. 

Reach 3 M1UJON Texans. Call tills newspaper for details.

D E E R  H U N T E R S  S P E C I A L :  5 0
a c r o s .  $ 5 9 5 /a c r o ,  w o o d o d ;  o x c o l lo n t  
h u n t in g ,  c o u n ty  r o a d  T o xa s  V o lo ra n  o r 
O w n o r fin a n c in g . 10%  d o w n . F o x  R o a l 
E s ta to ,  5 0 0  B u c h a n a n  D r . ,  B U R N E T .  
T o x a s  5 1 2 - 7 5 6 - 6 0 6 6 .

O W N  Y O U R  B U S IN E S S . E x c e p t io n a l 
p ro f its ,  s ta r t  o a rn in g  m o n o y  n o w . N o  a g o  
l im it .  K n ifo /S c is s o r  s h a rp o n in g  M o d o rn  
o q u ip m o n t.  c o m p lo to  tra in in g  $ 2 ,9 9 5  
to ta l. 1 8 0 0  4 5 1 -3 3 3 4  F rc o  c a l l l

S H A R E  A M E R IC A I  W a lls  m u s t  fa l l l  
D o a d lin o s  n o a r l  A IS E  E x c h a n g o  S tu ­
d e n ts  a w a it  fa m ily  c a l l  fo r  A u g u s t  31 
c o u n tr io s / lo c a l re p re s e n ta tiv e ) J u s t fo o d , 
b o d . s h a r in g !  E x c it in g l R o w a rd in g !  R e l-  
o v a n t l L ifo t im o l 1 -8 0 0  S IB L IN G
F R IE N D L Y  H O M E  P A R T IE S  h a s  o p o n - 
in g s  fo r  d e m o n s tra to rs . N o  c a s h  in v e s t­
m e n t N o  s o rv ic o  ch a r g o  H ig h o s t c o m  
m is s io n  a n d  h o s to s s  a w a rd s  T h rc o  c a ta  
log s , o v o r 8 0 0 ito m s  C a ll 1 -6 0 0  4 8 8 -4 8 7 5

A R E  Y O U  R E C E IV IN G  p a y m o n ts  o n  a 
ro a l o s la to  c o n tra c t o r  d e e d  o f tru s t?  W o  
c o n v e r t o w n o r  f in a n c e d  c o n tra c ts  to  c a s h  
C a ll A m o r ic a n  E q u ity  F u n d in g . In c  1 8 0 0  
874  2 3 8 9 .

W H A T 'S  S O  D IF F E R E N T  abou t tho H ap py 
Ja ck  3  X flo a  co lla r?  It w o rks !!! For d o g s  & 
ca ts l A t F a rm la n d  & D oub le  C irc lo  C o  O p s & 
boBor Ico d  stores

O A K  LO G  H O M E S  aro boau tifu lta ffo rdab lo  
C a lt\v n to  lo r  in fo rm a tion  G asbnoau  Log  
H om os. B ox 248. D op t 743. N o w  B loom fie ld . 
M O  650G3. T d e p h o o o  8 0 0  6 5 4  9 2 53

N E E D  C A S H 7 7 ?  R c c o iv in g  m o r tg a g o  
p a y m o n ts ?  W o  b u y  o w n o r  f in a n c o d  m o rt-  
g a g o s  lo c a lly  a n d  n a b o n w id o  A s k  fo r 
D o n n a  a t D iv e rs if ie d  F u n d in g  C o rp o ra tio n  
to d a y  Ml C a ll 1 -800  9 5 0  4 1 1 2 .

1991  P A L M  H A R B O R  d o u b lo w id e s -  
5 B R /3 B A  o n ly  $34.90011 4 B R /2 B A  o n ly  
$29.90011 3 B R /2 B A  o n ly  $24.90011 V is it  
th o  fa c to ry ,  s a v o  th o u s a n d s . F R E E  fa c ­
to ry  to u rs .  U b o ra l f in a n c in g  C a ll 1 -8 0 0 - 
8 8 0  S A V E
A  U T O  L O  A  N S  11N o  c ro d i t c h o c k . n o  d o w n  
p a y m o n t. G u a ra n to o d  A p p ro v a l 1987- 
1991 m o d e ls . 1 8 0 0  2 3 5  4 4 8 7 .

M O B IL E  H O M E  B U Y E R S . D riv e  a  lit t lo  
s a v o  a  lo t F U Q U A  d e a ra n c o  sa le . S a v e  
th o u s a n d s  $ $ $ $ $  B o s t b u ilt  in  T o x a s  
V is it F U Q U A  F a c lo ry  O u tlo t 1 8 0 0 -8 9 9 -  
0 4 4 0
W O L F F  T A N N IN G  B E D S : n e w  c o m ­
m e rc ia l h o m e  u n its  fro m  $ 1 9 9 . L a m p s , 
lo t io n s ,  a c c e s s o r ie s .  M o n th ly  p a y m o n ts  
lo w  a s  $ 1 8 . C a ll to d a y  F ro e  n o w  c o lo r  
c a ta lo g  1 -8 0 C M 6 2  9 1 9 7 .

A  W O N D E R F U L  F A M IL Y  e x p e r ie n c e . 
A u s tra lia n . E u ro p e a n . S c a n d in a v ia n . J a p a ­
n e s e  h ig h  s c h o o l e x c h a n g e  s tu d e n ts  a r ­
r iv in g  in  A u g u s t B e c o m e  a  h o s t fa m ily / 
A m o ric a n  In to rc u ltu ra l S tu d e n t E x c h a n g o . 
C a ll 1-8 0 0 -S IB L IN G .
O W N E R  O P E R A T O R S , T R A C T O R S o n ly  
fo r  4 8  s ta to  f la tb e d  d iv is io n  L a to  m o d o l 
tra c to rs  n e c d o d  5 0 %  a d v a n c e , in s ta n t 
s o tt lo m o n ts . 1st in  1st o u t d is p a tc h . P F T  
R o b o rs o n  8 0 0 -4 4 1 -0 6 8 9 .
B E C O M  E A  P A  R A L E G A L  Jo in  A m e ric a  s 
fa s to s t g ro w in g  p ro fe s s io n  W o *k  w ith  a t ­
to rn e y s . L a w y o r  in s tru c te d  h o m o  s tu d y  
T h o  f in e s t p a ra le g a l p ro g ra m  a v a ila b le  
F re o  c n tn lo g u o  8 0 0 -3 6 2 *7 0 7 0  D e p t LH  
722

P IO N E E R  S T E E L  B U IL D IN G S
3 0 X 4 0 X 1 0 ... $ 4 ,3 5 0 ; 3 0 X 5 0 X 1 2 ...$ 5 .4 9 5 ; 
40X 75X 12 $ 8 .6 9 5 .SOX 100X12 ..$12 ,995 ; 
1 0 0 X 1 0 0 X 1 4 . . .$ 2 4 ,9 9 5 .  A L L  S IZ E S .  
M m i-S to ra g o s . 1 -8 0 0 -6 3 7 -5 4 1 4 .

M A K E  T H E  R IG H T  c h o ic e  D ie ts  d o n ’t 
w o rk  B o d y  W is e  d o o s  ro d u c o  b o d y  fa t. 
in c re a s e  o n o rg y , lo w e r c h o le s te ro l. C a ll 1- 
8 0 0 -4 5 7 -4 0 9 9  fo r fro e  in fo rm a tio n , n o  o b ­
lig a tio n .
L A N D  B O N A N Z A I 4 %  in to ro s t o n  T o x a s  
fo r fo ito d la n d  A v o ra g o  1 0 a c ro s ,$ 0 -d o w n . 
$ 9 2 -m o n th ly  fo r  3 6 0  m o n th s . A ll a re a s . 
H o m o s ito . g o ta w a y . h u n b n g , in v e s tm e n t. 
S ta to  a u th o r iz e d  a g e n t 1 -8 0 0 -2 7 5 -R E P O .
A D O P T IO N : F U L L -T IM E  M O M ,lo v in g  d a d  
a n d  c u d d ly  c a t s e a rc h in g  fo r  s p o d a l n o w - 
b o m  to fill o u r  h e a rts  B e a u tifu l r iv e rs id e  
h o m o  w ith  g a rd e n , s a n d b o x  a n d  ju n g le  
g y m  S u m m e rs  a t th o  b o a c h , v a c a tio n s  in  
S c a n d in a v ia . C h r is tm a s o s  a t G ra n d m a ’s 
E x p o n s o s  p a id  P lo a s o  c a ll B ro n d a  a n d  
J o h n  o o llo c t a n y b m o  1 -2 1 2 -9 2 8  9 0 7 8

L a w n  M o w e r  R e p a ir  & S a le

•va Tune-Ups & Parts For Sale 
• • • *7 Days A Week • • • •

629-1280
307 W. P atterson E astland

CEK 57

Vic’s Welding
323 N. Commerce Ranger, TX 76470

• Heliarc & Wire Feed Aluminum 
Welding - Heavy or Light 

• Portable & Shop Arc Welding 
• Custom Fabrication
Call 817-647-5120

Phone answered 24 hours, 7 days
Owner: Vic Huerta CER104

Carroll electric
Service

Commercial, Industrial, Oilfield 
Holes dug - Service Poles set -

Trenching

R on C arroll ■ ow n er
Phone days 
817-629-3315 
P.O. Drawer 269

Nites 
817-647-3945 

CTJU4 Eastland, Texas

N O TIC ES

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The Eastland County 
Sheriff’s Department will 
be accepting bids on a 
1987 Honda G.L. 1200 
Aspencade Motorcycle 
until 4:00 p.m. on Friday, 
July 5, 1991 at the 
Eastland County 
Auditor’s Office on the 
2nd floor of the Eastland 
County Courthouse, 
Eastland, Texas. The mo­
torcycle can be seen from 
8:00 a.m. until 5:00 p.m. 
on Monday through Fri­
day at Mangum’s Service 
Center, Hwy 80 East, 
Eastland, Texas.
Bids will be opened dur­
ing the regular meeting 
of the Eastland County 
Commissioners at 1:30 
p.m. on Monday, July 8, 
1991 in the Commission­
ers’ Courtroom in the 
Courthouse. Eastland 
County Sheriff’s Depart­
ment reserves the right 
to accept and/or reject 
any and/or all bids.

T52

NOTICES
Eastland County is now 
taking proposals for 
Group Health Insurance. 
Information may be ob­
tained in the Auditor’s 
Office, Courthouse, 
Room 205. Proposals 
may be mailed to Eastland 
County Judge, P 0  Box 
327, Eastland, TX 76448 
or may be presented at 
the Regular Meeting on 
August 12,1991 at 10:00 
o’clock A.M., at which 
time all proposals will be 
opened. Eastland County 
reserves the right to re­
ject any or all proposals 
not in the County’s best 
interest.

T54

LIVESTOCK

CALVES FOR SALE: 
Fresh calves and Stock­
ers nurse cows too. 817- 
734-2610.

T56

ATTENTION BINGO  
PLAYERS - The Ameri­
can Legion will be hold­
ing a bingo game every 
Tuesday night at 7:30 p.m. 
You don’t have to be a 
member to come out and 
play. The game will be 
straight Bingo, Double 
Bingo, and Black Out 
Bingo, on the game card. 
The Bingo game will be at 
the VFW Post. The VFW 
is about 3 miles from 
Eastland on the Lake 
Leon Road, you can’t 
miss it.
For more information call 
E. J. Sharp, ADJ, 653- 
2360.

FOR SALE: Holstein Baby 
Calves. Direct from dairy. 
Call 442-1618.

T58

W ANTED

WANTED: Bookkeeping 
job, full or part-time. 
Experienced A/R & A/P, 
payroll, word processing/ 
computer skills, 2 years 
experience WP51. Call 
647-3160 or write to: P.O. 
Box 372, Ranger TX 
76470.

R104

W ANTED

WANTED: Organist for 
the 1st United Methodist 
Church services. Call Bob 
Johnson at 647-3533 or 
Rev. Bill Reed at 647- 
3145.

WANTED: Organist for 
the 1st United Methodist 
Church services in 
Ranger. Cali Bob 
Johnson at 647-3533 or 
Rev. Bill Reed at 647- 
3145.

R52

KING INSURANCE AGENCY 
REAL ESTATE

207 Main Ranger 
647-1171

OLDEN-Very nice 4 BR, 2 bath, BV dwg., large 
living area with fireplace, plant rm, kitchen with 
built-ins & breakfast bar, CHA, covered patio, 
shade trees, 2-car garage.
THREE BR, 2 bath, CHA, garage, several small 
storage bldgs, fenced yard, new roof.
NICE small frame dwg., 2 BR, 1 bath, living- 
ding, RM, kitchen with lots of cabinets, stove & 
refrigerator, fenced back yard, 1 car garage. 
NICE RENTAL PROPERTY: 4 apartment 
complex. 1 BR, 1 bath, L-D area ample closets, 
CHA, BV on 1 acrea, NEAR SCHOOL.
ROCK DWG, large L-D rm, 3 BR, 2 bath, 
utility, 2 car garage storage bldg, bam, 2 horse 
stalls, on 11 lots, fenced, 1 tank REASONABLY 
PRICED.
3 BR, 1 bath, new roof and painted, plus stove & 
ref 75X141 comer lot, 2 car garage.
3 BR, 2 bath, large den, large L-D rm, 2 car guilt- 
in garage, utility rm, large storage or work rm, 
sm. metal bldg.
3 rm, 1 bath, L-rm, den, 5 lots, MAKE OFFER. 
60 wooded acres, 2 stock tanks, very nice BV 
dwelling, 2 rm’s, 2 baths, large living-dining area 
with fireplace, plenty of closed space, CHA, just 
1.2 miles from city limites, GOOD HUNTING.

OPAL KING-BROKER LEE RUSSELL 
647-1171 647-1383

THANK
YOU Men In Service

Dear Friends: Words are 
inadequate to express 
our appreciation to all of 
our many friends in Cisco 
and surrounding areas 
and for cards, visits, 
foods, flowers and most 
of allthe prayers that were 
extended to Don and us 
during his brief illness 
and death.

Janice Shepard, 
Krista, Brent,
Kim and Kari

C51

TEXAS
PERFORMANCE
REVIEW

We would like to express 
our appreciation to all the 
friends who sent cards, 
phoned messages, pre­
pared food and ex­
pressed words of sympa- 
thy to us at thetimeof the 
loss of our loved one. 
The family would also 
thank those who so 
promptly and diligently 
aided at the Eastland 
baseball park and at 
Eastland Memorial Hos­
pital.
Knowing that so many 
cared and shared in our 
sorrow is a comfort to 
each of us.
Your consideration, 
thoughtfulness and kind­
ness will always be re­
membered.

Roy Cozart
Shirley Gary, James and 

Toffie Wheat,
Jeff McCoy, Dartez, 

Colleen and 
Will Brumley

T52

JAMES THACKERSON

M arine Lance Cpl. 
Jam es A. Thackerson, 
whose wife, Michelle, is 
the daughter of Jimmy D. 
and Darlene Hampton of 
Rt. 1, Gorman, recently 
returned from deploy­
ment to the Middle East 
in support of Operation 
Desert Storm while serv-

FDIC AUCTION
35 Texas Properties

R esid en tia l, C o m m ercia l & L and

July 11 • 7:30 pm
Brownwood Holiday Inn

515 N. Commerce

Cisco Properties:
13 203 E.Bth St.: This 1500 

sq. ft former beauty salon is 
localed on .132 acres, nice 
clean bock commercial 
building

14 207 L  8th: Large 8100 sq. 
ft commercial building located 
on an 11,500 sq. ft. lot. the 
building is a former laundromat 
with washer and dryer hook­
ups available

15 301 E. 8th St.: 1 large va­
cant, 50x115 ft  commercial lot 
close to downtown Cisco, 
ready for development

16 207 E. 7th Ave. C: This 
nice clean 977 sq ft commer­
cial building with central heat 
& air is located on a 50x115 ft 
lot

17 608 E. 18th St.: 2.818 Acre 
tract of land with 4 vacant 
buildings

For more information 
1-800-346-0502

EAGLE c5o
Real Estate £

i The M a r k c t in ^ C o ,  Inc —
0 4  W WllOW. EXID.OK 73701 .405-2)7 011

ing with Marine Attack 
Squadron-331, Marine 
Corps Air Station, Cherry 
Point, N.C.

Operation Desert Storm 
was the largest deploy­
ment of U.S. m ilitary 
forces since Vietnam. The 
operation was in response 
to Iraq ’s invasion of 
Kuwait and th rea t to 
Saudi Arabia.

A 1989 g raduate  of 
Carbon High School, Car­
bon, he joined the Marine 
Corps in August 1989.

LILLIS K. KOHLERT

Air Force Reserve Air­
man 1st Class Lillis K. 
Kohlert has graduated 
from the communications- 
computer systems opera­
tions specialist course at 
Keesler Air Force Base, 
Biloxi, Miss.

Students were taught 
how to operate and main­
tain electronic data proc- 
essingequipment, includ­
ing software, tape and 
disk management, and 
other related tasks.

Kohlert is the daughter 
of Barbara L. Hollis and 
stepdaughter of Roy C. 
Hollis of RR 2, Eastland.

She is a 1987 graduate 
of South west Texas State 
University at San Mar­
cos.

Got an idea about how 
our state government 

could be more efficient? 
Here's the chance 
you've waited for!
Call us toll-free at

1 -8 0 0 -B E A T  WASTE
(1-800-232-8927)
(You're not required 
to give your namel)

USE THE 
CLASSIFIEDS

C isco P ress  - 
E astlan d  T elegram  
R anger T im es

Sunday,
June 30,1991

College Students, 
Friends Away 
would love a 

subscription to The 
Ranger Times

P astoral C o u n se lin g  C en ter
820 W. Main - Eastland

C h a p la in  T . D . W h i t e h o m
M . E d  

629-2266
By Appointment Only CER56

Approximately 8-19 million 
people suffer from leakage of 
urine. This in not necessary.

"Urinary Incontinence Seminar"
Thursday, July 11 

1:00 p.m.
Community Room

Harris Methodist Erath 
County Hospital Stephenville 
411N. Belknap Stephenville
Call 817-965-1534 for reservation.

Dr. A.T. Deshmukh M.D., Board Certified 
Urologist, will be conducting the discussions.

Use the Classifieds

F a rm e rs  In s u ra n c e  
Group Is looking for a 
professional sales per­
son to develop a new  
Auto, Fire, Life & Busi­
ness Insurance Agency 
in the Eastland, Cisco 
& R angerareas. W e will 
help  you  bu ild  yo u r  
business with com pre­
hensive training and a 
g u a ra n te e d  in c o m e  
program . You can start 
on a part tim e basis and  
earn full com m ission  
while you learn. Once  
yo u  c o m p le te  y o u r  
training you will oper­
ate your own Agency  
with unlim ited income  
potential. If you have 
the am bition and the  
ability to run your own  
business. Contact: 

SONNY HARVEY, 
DISTRICT MANAGER  

FARM ERS  
INSURANCE GROUP  

P. O. BOX 6102  
ABILENE, TX 79608  

915-692-4981
C ER 53

Line
For Women

RuthStewart, M.Ed.
Q. (Continued) What are some ways I can im­

prove as a follower of my husband's wishes for 
our family?

A. 4. Be Obedient. Obedience may not be popu­
lar, but it is probably the most important rule in 
being a good follower. A spirit of harmony can 
never exist in the homes of the disobedient. A 
husband can be softened by a yielding spirit.

5. Support His plans and decisions. She will 
have to take a look at his plans or decisions 
before she can offer sincere support.

(More To Follow)
Source "FASCINATING WOMANHOOD" by Helen B. Andelin.

Questions should be addressed to:
Rescue Line 
P.O. Box 269 

Cisco, Texas 76437 CER104

Keys Made Locks Changed or Repaired

ELROD'S
MOBILE LOCK SHOP

423 W. Main Ranger, Texas 76470

Phone 647-3444
Bonded Locksmith 

Auto -- Risidential — Commercial
CER104

8 I 7/629-363 I O P E N  1 : 0 0  - 5:30  
SAT.  8 :0 0  • 12:30

E x p r e s s  P h o t o
SAME DAY PHOTO PROCESSING

C O L O R .  B L A C K  l W H I T E .  P H O T O  R E P R O D U C T I O N

BILL C U L V E R H O U S E .  
O W N E R

601 W .  M a in  
E A S T L A N D .  TX 76448

DON’T OVERLOOK 
YOUR INSURANCE NEEDS

.

Serving Eastland County Since 1919

CONTACT
D.L. KINNAIRD  

GENERAL INSURANCE

\

\

J - ' k t r
• :/ -  ~  ,

y j. i I 1 1 1 1 kj
\

Pam Rogers, Owner

R & R  
CARPET  

CLEANERS
• Carpet •

• Car Upholstery •
• Furniture • 

Re-do Headliners •
• Offering Scotch

Guard •
Water Extractions •

For Free Estimates
629-2544 

Sallie Kinnaird 104 N. Lamar
629-8606 

Mike Perry

Call Collect

647-1211

• I

il

*ft

CER104



Obituaries
Jam es D. Lew is

James Dwight Lewis, 
Jr., 28 of Ft. Smith, Ar­
kansas and formerly of 
E astland  died Friday 
evening, June 21, 1991 in 
Ft. Smith, Arkansas in a 
apartment fire. Services 
were held at 10:30 A.M. 
Thursday, June 27, 1991 
at the Edwards Funeral 
Home Chapel with Rev. 
Lee Rodgers officiating, 
assisted  by Rev. Rex 
Boggs. Burial was in the 
Eastland Cemetery, di­
rected by Edwards Fu­
neral Home of Eastland.

Mr. Lewis was bom on 
July 29,1962 in Lubbock.
He attended Eastland 
schools. He was a plant
worker, working in the 
Eastland County area 
until moving to Arkansas 
in 1986, where he worked

for Hudsons Foods. He 
was married to the for­
mer Wendy Cook.

Survivors include wife, 
Wendy Lewis of Fort 
Smith, Arkansas; father, 
James D. Lewis, Sr. of 
Eastland; mother and 
stepfather, Joy and Jack 
Webber of Eastland; a son 
Jam es D arrell of 
Eastland; three brothers 
and sisters-in-law, Greg 
and Kay Daniel ofComan- 
che, Billy and Lynn Daniel 
of Austin, and Jason 
Lewis of Fort Sm ith, 
Arkansas; a step-brother, 
Henry Webber of Snyder; 
a sister, Brenda Daniel 
Harrison of Fort Worth; a 
step-sister and her hus­
band, Linda and Mike 
Terry of Snyder, and sev­
eral nieces and nephews.

Hazel Wilbar
GORDON-Hazel Wil­

bar, 81, died Thursday, 
June 27,1991, in a Dallas 
hospital.

Services were at 11 
a.m. Saturday , June 
29,1991, at First United 
Methodist Church with 
the Rev. Henry Kile 
Smith officiating. Burial 
was in the New Gordon 
Cemetery, directed by 
Edwards Funeral Home 
of Strawn.

Miss Wilbar was born 
in Gordon, graduated 
from Paskel High School 
in Fort Worth in 1926 and 
Northwestern University 
in 1930. She taught school 
in Gordon five years be­
fore working at F irst 
National Bank until her 
retirement in 1972. She 
was a Presbyterian.

Survivors include a sis­
ter, Mable Borchers of 
Dallas.

Remodeling - Siding
Windows and D oors" 

Jobbers For All Sides 
Reynolds, Mastic and B.M.D. 
Siding, Windows, and Doors 

Also Remodeling & Add-Ons.
Cover Facers and 

Overhang on Brick Homes. 
All Work Guaranteed.

Butler & Fox
Phone 629-2149 or 629-2814

W U I I

CUR 104

GET IN THE PROGRAM
8c

GM Program Cars Help You
S A V E  B I G
1991 P o n t ia c  B o n n e v ille  (2) 

Sold New $19,248 
Sale Price $15,448
SAVE $4,

1991 P o n t ia c  G ran d A m  4 dr. (4)
Sold New $13,186 
Sale Price $9,886
SAVE $3,300

1991 C a d illa c  S e v il le  
Sold New $35,876 
Sale Price $23,376

SAVE $12,500

1991 O ld s 88 R o y a le  B r o u g h a m  
Sold New $21,761 
Sale Price $17,261
SAVE $4,500

JIM CALDWELL 
MOTOR CO.

Cadillac-Olds-Buick-Pontiac-GMC
Ilwy. 80 E. Eastland

C.D. D owis
C.D. (Scottie) Dowis, 74, 

of Eastland, died Wednes­
day, June26, 1991,atHu- 
mana Hospital in Abilene.

Services were at 2 p.m. 
Friday, June 28, 1991, at 
Calvary Baptist Church 
with the Rev. Tommy 
Simms officiating. Burial 
was in the Childress 
cemetery, directed by 
Schooler-Gordon Funeral 
Home.

He was born January 
11, 1917, in McLean. He 
was a graduate of Chil­
dress High School and at-

LEastland Memorial 
Hospital Report

Admissions 
Ju n e  25,1991

Mitchell L. Campbell 
Nora Harbin 
Connie Henry 

Collis D. Leach 
Bessie L. Moffett 
Erby Slemmons 
Tana G. Stapp 

Baby Girl Stapp 
Jim E. Wheeler 

Dismissals 
Clinton E. Casey 

Lonnie A. Franklin 
Dismissals 

Ju n e  26,1991 
Collis D. Leach 
Erby Slemmons 
Tana G. Stapp 

Baby Girl Stapp 
Admissions 

Ju n e  27,1991 
Dee D. Gillentine 

Dismissals 
Mitchell L. Campbell 

Jim E. Wheeler

Grandpaw’s 
Tool Shed 

Rental
Grinder Turns 

Yard W aste To 
Garden Mulch.

l akes limbs up to 
3" in diameter

1304 E. Main 
Eastland 

Travis Chapman 
629-3363

5-104

O c c u p a t io n a l
A c c id e n t
C o v er a g e

for Non Subscribers 
to Worker Comp

1-800-880-5080
call for quote 5-53

tended college for two 
years. He wasin the Army 
during World War II.He 
was retired. He was a 
member of the Park 
Heights Baptist Church 
in San Angelo. He moved 
to Eastland about two 
years ago from Childress.

His wife, C hristeen 
Dowis, preceded him in 
death.

Survivors include his 
son and daughter-in-law, 
Mickey andMaxine Dowis 
of Eastland; a brother, 
Robert Dowis of Irving; 
two s is te rs , F rankie 
Holton of Childress and 
Ruby Dousett of High­
land, C alifornia; his 
mother, Clara English of 
Childress; three grand­
daughters; and three 
great-grandchildren.

%ead dhe

Classifieds

T e x a n s  M a y  B e  
H e lp  In  P a y in g

Some low-income Tex­
ans may be eligible for 
help in payingcoolingbills 
this summer through the 
Home Energy Assistance 
Program, according to the 
Texas D epartm ent of 
Human Services.

The one-time payment 
is available to many low- 
incomehouseholds. Appli­
cations for energy assis­
tance were mailed to 
households that received 
food stamps, Aid to Fami­
lies with Dependent Chil­
dren, or Supplemental 
Security Income in May. 
Other low-income indi­
viduals may request an 
application by calling the 
toll-free number 1-800- 
252-8060 during the en­
rollment period of July I 
through July 31.

Eligibility is limited by 
gross income and re ­
sources. Aid is available 
for a one person house­
hold having less than 
$628.49 gross income per 
month. The gross income

E lig ib le  F o r  
C o o lin g  B i l l s

limits are $842.49 for 
households of two per­
sons, $1,056.49 for three, 
$1,270.49 for four, 
$1,484.49 for Five, and 
$1,698.49 for six.

Households are eligible 
if the cost for cooling is 
included in the rent pay­
ment or if the household 
pays a portion of its home 
energy costs.

Energy assis tance  
checks are sent directly to 
the people who are eli­
gible for assistance. How­
ever, the checks are made 
payable to the energy 
provider.

People receiving one of 
these energy assistance 
checks should mail it or 
take it in prson to the 
energy provider business 
office with their regular 
energy bill. The check can 
be cashed only by the 
energy provider. If the 
HEAP check is more than

Get Sunsmart
In Texas, summer is a 

time of holidays, picnics, 
swimming...and sunburn. 
Often considered a mere 
nuisance, a sunburn is red 
and sore for a while, but 
then is gone.

Unfortunately, the ef­
fects of sunburn are very 
longlasting. Research 
increasingly suggests that

the energy bill, the addi­
tional amount will be cred­
ited to the person’s ac- 
countfor the next month’s 
bill. If the energy bill is 
higher than the check, the 
person is responsible for 
paying the difference.

sunburn and overexpo­
sure to the sun are impor­
tant in the developement 
of adult skin cancer.

So th is  sum m er, be 
sunsmart and “Slip-Slop- 
Slap”! Slip on a shirt, slop 
on sunscreen, and slap on 
a hat!

Your local American 
Cancer Society volunteers 
are available with pro­
gram m ing for bible 
schools, day care centers, 
and other youth groups. 
Call P re s id en t Lesa 
Oswalt at 629-2127 for 
more information about 
free “su n sm a rt” pro­
grams.

4 Pharmacy

Sauires
Roofing Contractors

45 Years In Service

Carbon - Eastland

Cisco P ress-E astland 
Telegram - R anger 
Times 0

Sunday, 
June 30,1991

Topics
By Bob Mueller

Planning a trip abroad? For health alerts and infor­
mation on health requirements, call the U.S. Public 
Health Service's Communicable Disease Center 
hotline, l-(404)-332-4559.

* * *

653-2397 CEK104 653-2354

F O R  R E N T

3 BR, Rising Star Hwy $300 mo./w 6 months lease 
Call to see.

F O R  SA LE

COMMERCIAL BUILDING & LAND. COULD BE 
HOME & OFFICE OR BUSINESS. $54,000. 
3BDRM/2 bath home on Simms, 2 car garage, 
fenced w/storage bldg. $59,000. • , •
1004 W. 11th, 2 BDRM, 1 1/2 lot, $20,000. 
APPROX. 10 acres off Rising Star Hwy w/mobile 
home (2 BR), westbound water for only $18,000.

M cM illian Real Estate
Youvonne McMillan-Broker

8th & C. Hilton Ave. - Cisco, Texas 442-3846
Nancy Bacon, Associate 442-2679 CER104

n n .

MOBILE
HOME

TRANSPORTING
Complete Moves 

& Setups
Moving

Throughout Texas 
• Tie Downs

* Blocking
& Leveling

* Licensed
* Bonded
* Insured

18 Years Experience
817-893-6753

1. -A i h . »  ' U i V l K A  { . i t M

Hard work may be more effective than fun and 
games in shaking a bad mood, researchers at the 
University of Virginia found. Psychologists got best 
results motivating participants to expend effort on 
intellectual tasks.

Synthetic vitamin A product seems to ward off new 
tumors in the same head and neck area where an old 
cancer has been treated. Doctors at the University of 
Texas M.D. Anderson Cancer Center warn that 
isotretinoin has some severe side effects.

Arti ficial bone, grown in a jar, may soon be available 
to repair fractures. Researchers at Harvard Medical 
School and other laboratories are mixing compounds 
from proteins and ceramic materials that would 
patch the break until new bone formed.

New advances in medicine keep us on our toes. 
Make us part of your health care team at W al-M art 
Pharmacy, Hwy. 80 East, Eastland, 629-3347.

ccrsb!04

E &  E K u sto m  
P a in t &  B ody S hop

RONNIE, ROBBY & KENNY EDW ARDS

* » . 4
-  r

1713 W e s t C o m m e rce  
E as tla n d , T X  7 6 4 4 8  

P hone  (817) 6 2 9 -8 2 6 5

NOW 
YAMAHA 

GOLF CART 
DEALER 

Service & Sales CER51

7 - y d ' U r < Iuy  
J  ° a » l .  -  j „£ 7  \

C Jb trteC
1 HR.CLEANERS & LAUNDRY

r Summer Special
10% Off Laundry Wednesdays 

25% Off Dry Cleaning Saturdays

629-2636

Free Moth-Proof Storage Bag With 3 Garments or more 

Shady Oaks Shopping Center - Eastland - 629-3233
CER104

X, -

H a r d w a r e

'  4GE>
.  B U Y S j

A s A d v e rtis e d  
O n

N a tio n a l T V

WHILE SUPPLIES LASJ

2 '
Variable Tim er 
with Night Light
Four random settings turn ON & OFF 
at slightly varying times to avoid 
"timer" look. Auto nite light. 61758

A s A d v e rtis e d  
O n

N a tio n a l T V

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST

RADiATO* SPECIALTY H eavy Duty  
Puncture Seal
Non-flammable formula seals punc­
tures & inflates tire to full driving 
pressure. 18 oz. 82781

A s  A d v e rtis e d  
O n

N a tio n a l T V Q 97
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST

i l C f
32 Gallon 
Garbage Can
Sturdy plastic can has snap-lock 
cover to secure rubbish. Ace logo 
stamped on con & lid Red or brown
7 1 1 0 2 .6 ?

ANT & 
ROACH 
KILLER

■ 4 8 8
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST

AGE As Advertised
O n

N a to n s l T V

Insect Killer
Three fast acting formulas to kill 
wasps, onts & rooches or flying bugs. 
Safe to use, non-staining 15 02.
72676.72.75

H a r d w a r e
and Garden Center 4 .... —

OPEN
7 D « n  AWeek

504 EAST MAIN • EASTLANO. TEXAS 76440

817-629-3373
HOURS: tO O AM  as • 0 0  W L  

100  P U  IS 1O0 PM

w f MLCvf
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Engagem ent Eastland Exes Baseball Camp 
To Be Held July 12 And 13
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Pointer-W ade
Mrs. Collene Pointer of 

Cisco is proud to annouce 
the engagement and up­
coming marriage of her 
daughter, Linda Pointer, 
to Larry Wade of Cisco.

The bride-elect is man­
ager of Mott’s Variety 
Store in Cisco.

The prospective bride­

groom is self employed as 
an electrician in Cisco.

The couple plan to be 
married in a backyard 
ceremony at 612 West 
11th Street at 5 o’clock on 
the aflemoon of July 14, 
1991.

All re la tives and  friends 
are invited  to a tten d .

The first Eastland Exes 
Baseball Camp will be 
held from 9 a.m. to 3 p.m. 
on July 12 and 13 at the 
Eastland Baseball Com­
plex to provide Individual 
instruction in the funda­
mentals of hitting, field­
ing, and pitching for kids 
ages 7 to 13.

Registration fee will be 
$35.00 and more informa­
tion contact Ralph Ste­
vens at 629-1187 after *

5:00 p.m.
Reservations may be 

limited.
Instructors will be:
Greg Stevens - Pitch­

ers and outfielders
• 1988 graduate  of 

Eastland High School.
• Two time All-District 

selection.
• 1988 Fort Worth Star

Telegram All-Area Out­
fielder.

Former collegiate 
player atTexas Christian 
University in Fort Worth.

• PitchingCoach forsix 
Dennis Alvarez Baseball 
Camps over the past two 
years. The camps were 
conducted in both Fort 
Worth and Tuscaloosa, 
Alabama and consisted of 
15 to 100 kids each.

Joel Bulla - Infield- 
ers

• 1988 graduate  of 
Eastland High School.

• Two time All-District 
2nd Baseman.

• Currently a senior at 
Tarleton State Univer­
sity.

Tracy Fullen - Catch­
ers

• 1987 graduate  of

Eastland High School.
• All-District Catcher- 

Outfielder.
• 1987 Maverick Base­

ball Most Valuable 
Player.

• Currently a senior at
Tarleton State Univer-• •

sity.
The coaches played 

together for Eastland 
High School and for the 
summer league Eastland 
Reds. The Reds placed 3rd 
in the 1987 TTAB State 
Tournament and 4th in 
1988. They were also 
members of the Eastland 
Maverick District & Bi- 
District Champions. All 
three instructors were key 
com ponents of these 
teams which posted a

E astland  C ounty 4-H H orse Club 
To H old P layday J u ly  6 In C isco

There will be a playday, 
sponsored by the Eastland 
County 4-H Horse Club, 
held in Cisco at the Cisco 
arena on Saturday, July 
6 .

The playday is open to 
all 4-H members and non­
members.

Age groups will be 8 and 
under, 9 to 13, 14 to 18, 
and 19 and over (ages as 
of Jan. 1, 1991). Books 
open at 8 a.m. and the 
show starts at 9 a.m. Cost

combined record of 97 
wins and 19 losses.

per event will be $1.00.
Events will be show­

manship at halter, west­
ern pleasure, western 
riding, western horse­
manship, barrels, poles, 
flags and stakes race.

Due to rain out on June 
15, this will be the first of 
a three show series. Rib­
bons will be awarded in 
each class through sixth 
place. High-point belt 
buckles will be given away 
at the end of the series. To 
be eligible a contestant 
must enter at least two 
shows. For more informa­

tion call 817-442-3890 
Rain out will be resched 
uled at a later date.
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ONLY YOU CAN PREVENT FOREST FIRES
A Serv<( o* in« Fwest Sctvce. USD*. Vnt* 
rear Stite Foreiter*

M orton V alley School 
H om ecom ing Ju ly  6

Rising Star Junior Rodeo

July 4, 5 & 6
8:00 nightly

Rodeo Grounds, H ighway 36 East

l y i A.TESTIC THEATR£
1 X 629-1322

%ead dhe Classifieds
Cisco Press ■ Eastland Telegram  - 
Ranger Times

Sunday, June 30,1991
•  a  »

.. On July 6,1991, all for­
mer students and friends 
of Morton Valley School 
are gathering for a reun­
ion. The meeting will be 
held in the Eastland High 
School Cafeteria. This will

t *.

be the 50th anniversary 
for the graduating class 
of 1941. . r ■

The noon meal will be 
catered by Oscar’s Barbe­
cue from Cisco. There will

be a charge of $6.00 a plate 
which can be paid at the 
door upon arrival.

The schedule of events 
is Saturday: 10 a.m. cof­
fee and doughnuts; 10:30 
a.m. to 12 noon visitation; 
12:00-1:30 p.m. noon 
meal; 2:00 p.m. program 
and business meeting; 
4:00 p.m. dismiss until 
next reunion.

,r».

*
>h

Produced by Sammy Smith, 4 S Rodeo Co. 
Concession Stand Will Be Open
Admission: Adults $2.00, Children $1.00

For m ore info, call
817-643-3226, 643-6109
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KUNE DOWNEY* MORlARTY GOLI

A DELICIOUSLY MALICIOUS COMEDY.
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Fri. • Sat. • Sun. • Mon.
All Shows: 7:30 p.m. - $3.00

^  We NovvtKftM^-Admission Gift Passes - $ 1 0 ^
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Higginbotham-Bartlett 
Lumber Co.
629-1311 CHURCH DIRECTORY

Perkins Implement Co.
629-2665

* * 2 r «  aH m am th***

Vicki’s Beauty Shop
629-2032 M R  s ra A *

Dr. J.O. Jolly, Dentist
629-2033 or 629-2432

R.M. Sneed Contractor
629-1756

. . . »  • •

White Elephant Restaurant
442-9957

Eastland County Newspapers
629-1707

Cisco Funeral Home
442-1503

* •

U-Save Pharmacy
629-1166

Thornton Feed Mill
442-1122

J & J Air Conditioning
629-2251

Kimbrough Funeral Home
442-1211

Maxwell Appliance 
Service & Parts

629-1439

CISCO CHURCHES EASTLAND CHURCHES RANGER CARBON
FIRST EVANGELICAL 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Jerry McNeill, Pastor 
Hwy. 80 W. Cisco 

Across From Hospital 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Morning 
Worship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship 
7:00 pjn.; Wednesday Youth and Adult 
Bible 7:00 R,m., ._  / N , ,  „

1 .» 1J  t  ri j  ..

CALVARY*ARTIST CHURCH _  
_  .. Rev. Ronnie Shackelford

Pastor
18tb and Conrad Hilton, Cisco 

Sunday School 9:30 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:45 a.m.;Tnining Union 5:30p.m.; 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m.; Wednesday 
Prayer Meeting 7:00 p.m.

• « •

NIMROD BAPTIST CHURCH 
10 Miles SW of Cisco 
Rev. T.D. Whltehom 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Serv­
ices 11:00 a.m.;Training Union 6:00 p.m.; 
Evening Services 7:00 p.m.; Wednesday 
Services 7:00 p.m.

NEW LIFE TABERNACLE 
307 W. 17th SL - Cisco 
Rev. W.M. (BiH) Bailey 

Sunday School 10 a.m.; Worship i l  ajn. 
(Hour of Power); Old Fashion Prayer 
time 6 p.m.; Evangelistic Service 6:30 
p.m*. Bible Study 7:15 pjn. Wednesday.

GREATER ST. MARK BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Rev. John Hamilton, Pallor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship 6:00 
p.m. Wednesday Prayer Service 7:00 pjn.

MITCHELL BAPTIST CHURCH 
S. of Cisco off Hwy. 206 

Rev. Jessie Blgbee 
Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Preaching 11 
a.m.; Sunday Night 7:00 p.m.; Prayer 
Service Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Rev. AI Gary Pettigrew

Sunday School 9:45 ajn.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:45 a.m.; Evening Worship 6 p.m.; 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 7 p.m.

. . .

CHURCH OF CRinST .
Jim Yates, Minister 

Ave. N. • Cisco
Sunday Bible Classes 9:30 a.m.; Worship 
Service 10:30 a.m.; Evening Service 6:30 
p.m.; Wednesday Service 7:30 p.m. La­
dies 10:00 a.m. Tuesday.

\  YFAITH BAPTIST CHURCH 
W. 18th & Ave. J, Cisco 

Fundamental 
Dr. M. H. Clark, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Preaching 
Services at 11 a.m., and 7 p.m.; Wednes­
day Evening Service at 7:30.

FOURTH STREET CHURCH 
OF CHRIST 

701 W. 4th S t
Sunday 10:30 a.m.; Evening 5:00 p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF YAHWEH 
Welcome

Worship 11:00 a.m. Saturday.
Only 10 miles South of Cisco on U.S. 
Highway 183.

MOUNTAIN TOP CHURCH 
600 E. 8th S t  (Old Hwy. 80) - Cisco 

Pastor John C. Jonea 
Phone 442-4479

Praise In Word 10:30 a jn. Sunday, Evan­
gelist Service 6 p.m. Sunday; Bible Study 
7:30 p.m. Wednesday.

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH 
James E. Robertson, Jr., Minister ’ 

Services lit Sunday each month; Singing 
10:30 a.m.; Preaching 11:00.

GOSPEL ASSEMBLY 
1000 Ave. A and East 10th - Cisco 

442-1227
Kenneth Wctstone, Minister 

Sunday 10:00 a.m

EAST CISCO BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Larry Unam 
506 E. 11th -.Cisco

Sunday School 9:45.a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:50a.m.;Tra in ing Union 5:30p.m.; 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m.; Wednesday 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
303 W. 8th

Dick Summers, Pastor 
Phone 442-2125

Church School 9:40 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:50 a m.; Bible Study 6:30 p.m.; 
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

CATHOLIC CHURCHES 
Pastor: Fr. Thomas II. Teczar 

St. Francis, Eastland, 6:30p.m Saturday; 
St. Rita, Ranger, 9:45 a.m. Sunday, St 
John Strewn, 8:00 ajn., Sunday; Holy 
Rosary, Cisco 11:30 a.m. Sunday

• FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
f CHURCH *
Rev. David Leach 

405 West 8th, Cisco 
Sunday School class 9:45 a.m.. Nursery 
class provided; Worship service 10:50 
a.m.; Evening Worship 7 p.m

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
500 W. 6th SL-Cisco 

Rev. Robert E. Crumley 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Serv­
ice 11:00 a.m., a

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
202 W. 9th, Cisco 

Jim Manning
Sunday School 9:30 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:50 a.m.; Church Training 6:00 
p m.; Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.: Wed­
nesday Prayer Meeting 7:30 p.m.

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
Rev. James Morris 

307 W. 7th SL • Cbco 
Phone 442-1561

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:45 a.m.; Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Night 7:00 p.m.

•

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Fundamental 

Ave. E. at 17 St. - Cisco 
Rev. Bill Fee

Sunday School 10:00a.m.; Morning Serv: 
ice 11:00 a.m.; Evening Scrvice7:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Worship Service 7:30 p.m.

REDEEMER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Rev. Charles Mangone, Interium 
Conrad Hilton & E. 18th • Cisco 

Sunday School 9:15 a.m.; Worship Serv­
ice 8:00 a.m.

. . .

WESLEY UNITED METHODIST 
. ’ CHURCH
Rev. David Leach 

Ave. A. - Cisco
Morning Worship 9:00 a.m.; Family night 
2nd Thursday each month

HOLY TRINITY EPISCOPAL 
CHURCH 

Father Steve Smith 
915-356-2997 

710 S. Seaman
Sunday Service 9:00 a.m.; Communion 
Services.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
710 North Seaman 

J < \  Re v. Danny Brown
Sunday School 9:30 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Baptist Training Union 
6:00 p.m.; Evening Worship 7:00 pjn. 
Wednesday Night Service 7:00 p.m.

THE CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST 
OF LATTER DAY SAINTS 
Chapel Phone: 817-629-1383

Opening Exercise 9 a.m.; Relief Society 9 
- 9:50; Priesthood 9 - 9:50; Primary 9 - 
10:40; Sunday School 10 - 10:40; Sacra­
ment Mtg. 10:50- 12:00.

Branch President 
Floyd A. Alldredge 

Route 1 Box 166 
Ranger, Texas 76470 

647-3827

EASTLAND UNITED 
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 

206 N. Dixie
Rev. Bobby Hart, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Morning 
Worship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship 
7:00 p.m.; Wednesday Service 7:300 

. p.m.
—— • . 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Dr. Robert Jeffress

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship 7:00 
pjn.

BETHEL BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Dewey V. Lamb 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship 6 :00 
p.m.; Wednesday prayer meeting 
6:30 p.m.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH

Dr. Vaughn Baker, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Choir Practice 
10:30 a jn.; Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.; 
Evening Worship 6:00 pjn.

———
CALVARY BAPTIST 

. Rodger Ashley
Sunday School 10:00 a m.; Morning 
Worship 11:00 a.m.; Prayer Class 6:30 
p.m.; Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night Prayer Service 7:30 p.m.

CHURCH OF GOD 
613 W. Main - Eastland 

629-3129 
Rev. Jim Oglesby

Sunday School 10:00 a jn.; Evening Serv­
ice 7:00 p.m.; Wednesday Service 7:30 
p.m.

PLEASANT HILL BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Pleasant Hill Community 
Joe Phllpott, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Morning 
Wore hip 1!: 00 a .m.; Ev enin g S ervice 5:30 
p.m.

SOUTHSIDE PENTECOSTAL
107 New Street - Eastland 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning 7:00 p.m.; Midweek Service 7:00 
p.m. Thursday.

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Gary Montgomery 

Minister
Sunday School 9:30 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:20 a.m.; Evening Worship 6:00 
pjn.; Wednesday Worship 7:30 p.m,

• ••

LAKE LEON BAPTIST
John C. Taylor • 629-2350 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Sunday 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m.; Sunday 

Night Service 5:30-6:30 p.m.;
Wednesday Night Service 

. 7:00 - 8:00 p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
Kent Treadwell 

1608 \V. Commerce - Eastland
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Service 6:00 
pjn.; Wednesday Night 7:00 pjn.

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 
Dr. Bill Raddiff

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Morning 
Worship 11:00 a.m.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
(Disciples of Christ)

S. Lamar & Olive - Eastland 
Rev. Randy Cook

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Worship Serv­
ice 10:50 a.m:

WORD OF LIFE 
501 S. Lamar 

Robbie Moore, Pastor 
Sunday Morning 10:15 a.m.; Wednesday 
Evening 7:00 p.m.

INSPIRATION CHURCH OF GOD 
Authur Brown 

Camp Inspiration Box 167
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:45 a.m.; Evening Worship 6:00 
p.m,;* Wednesday Service 7:00 p.m.

CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Paster: Fr. Thomas H. Teczar 

647-3166.
Sl Francis, Eastland, 7:00 p.m. Saturday; 
St. Rita, Ranger, 10:30 a.m. Sunday: S t 
John Strewn, 8:30 a.m., Sunday: Holy 
Rosary, Cisco. 5:00 p.m. Saturday

EASTLAND CHRISTIAN SCIENCE 
SOCIETY

Sunday Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.; 
Service on First Wednesday of the Month 
7:30 p.m.

All Are Welcome

PRIEMERA IGLESIA BAUTISTA 
EASTLAND, TEXAS 

(First Mexican Baptist Church) 
Pastor Eddie Gonzales

3 Miles W. of Eastland on Hwy. 80 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Morn­
ing Worship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Service 
7:00 pjn.; Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

FAITH BAPTIST CHURCH 
105 W. Plummer, Eastland 

653-2438
Pastor R.L. O'Quinn

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Morn­
ing Service 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Evening 
Service 6:30 p.m.

m — -

MARANATHA BAPTIST 
Independent - Fundamental 

Pastor M.H. Jones 
RL 2 Box 57B, Cisco, Texas 
Hwy. 80 West of Eastland 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Worship Hour 
11:00 a.m.; Prayer Gasses 6:00 p.m.; 
Worship Hour 6:30 p.m.; Wednesday 
Services 7:30 p.m.

»••

SOUTHSIDE BAPTIST MISSION 
(S.B.C., Mangum Sponsors)

1509 South Seaman 
Larry Briley, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m., 7:00 pjn.; Wednesday 7 
p.m.

CHURCH ON THE WAY 
Pastor Ron Allman

Meets For Every Service At 
305 W. Plummer

Sunday Morning 10:30 a.m.; Sunday 
Night 6:30 p.m.; Wednesday Night 7:14 

p.m.

FIRST PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
311 S. Lamar 

Dr. D.P. Sadowskl
Sunday Morning 10 a.m. Sunday 

Evening 6 p.m. Wednesday evening 7

EASTSIDE BAPTIST CHURCH 
4 & Young SL - Ranger 

647-1478
David Jordan, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Serv­
ice 11:00 a.m.; Sunday Evening 7:00 pjn.; 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.
Children’s Mission Groups 7:00 p.m. 
Youth Choir 6:00. Nursery Provided.
1 - 1  * t  < P Y< I » q  r  I

j  CHURCH OF CHRIST 
203 Mesquite - Ranger 

647-3425
Jim Hull, Minister

Sunday Bible Class 9:45 a.m.; Sunday 
Worship 10:45 a.m.; Sunday Evening 
Service 7:00 pjn.; Wednesday Service 
7:00 p.m.

. m mm

CHURCH OF GOD 
601 Pershing - Ranger 

647-1136
Rev. James H. Lee

Sunday Morning Service 9:45 a.m.; Sun­
day Morning Worship 10:45 a.m.; Sunday 
Children’s Church 10:45 u n .; Sunday 
Evening 6:00 p.m.; Wednesday Service 
7:30 p.m.

* •
CHURCH OF GOD OF PROPHECY 

. North Oak - Ranger 
George Parker, Pastor

Sunday Morning Service 9:45 a jn.; Sun­
day Morning Worship 11JX) a.m.; Sunday 
Children’s Church 11:00 ajn.; Wednes­
day Service 7:30 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Walnut at Marston • Ranger 

647-3261 
Rev. Bill Owens

Sunday Morning Bible Study 9:45 a.m.; 
Sunday Morning Worship 10:50 a.m.; 
Sunday Evening Worship 5:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Bible Study-Preyer Meeting 
6:30 p.m.

I
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 

’ 404 W. Main - Ranger 
647-3251

Rev. James Upshaw
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Serv­
ice 11:00 a.m.; Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 p.m.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

411 Elm St. Ranger 
647-1124

Bill Reed, Pastor *
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Worship Serv­
ice 10:50 a.m.

SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH 
Commerce and Pine SL - Ranger 

647-3271
Rev. Jasper Massegee 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Sunday Service 
11:00 a.m.; Sunday Evening Service 6:00 
p.m.; Wednesday Prayer Meeting 6:00

FIRST PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
Caddo Rd. • Ranger

Pastor Kenneth Colegrove
Sunday Service 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning Service 6:30 p.m.; Wednesday Bible 
Study 7:30 p.m.

ST. RITA'S CHURCH 
1109 Blackwell Rd. - Ranger647-3167 

Pastor: Fr. Thomas H. Teczar 
St Francis, Eastland, 7:00 p.m. Sat;St. 
Rita, Ringer, 10:30 a.m Sun. St. John 
Strewn, 8:30 a.m., Sun.; Holy Rosary, 
Gsco 5:00 p.m. Satur.

ST. PAUL BAPTIST 
501 Cherry SL, Ranger, Texaa 

Sunday School 10:00 a jn.; Worship Serv­
ice 11:00 ajn.; Wednesday 6:30 pjn. 
Prayer Services, Mission Study.

Rev. Audry Wesley, Pastor

MERRIMAN BAPTIST CHURCH 
Merrlman Rd. - Ranger 

Pastor Lester Swan
Sunday School 10:00 ajn.; Sunday Serv­
ice 11:00a jn.; Sunday Night Service 6:30 
p jn .; Wednesday Night Service 7:00 pjn.

TABERNACLE OF FAITH 
' 507 Cypress 

Ranger, Texas 76470
Thursday evening services 7 pjn.; Satur­
day 7 p.m.; Sunday 7 p.m.

RIDDLE STREET BAPTIST 
Pajtor: Rev. Robert Dunkerson

Sun. Mara. Scrv. 11 ajn .; Sun. night 5:30 p m

FULL GOSPEL 
Pastor Jimmy Maples 

P.O. Box 423
Hwy. 6 at Caution Light, Carbon

CARBON CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Randy Moody

Bible Study 10:00 a.m.*v Morning Worship 
11:00 a m.; Evening Worship 6:00 pjn.;
Wednesday Night Service 7:30 p.m.snrp ' * y f t *
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH CARBON 

Rev. George W. Weeks 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 ajn.; Training Union 6.00 p.m.; 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.; Wednesday 
Night Prayer Meeting 7:00 p.m.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
Rev. Luther Helm

Sunday School 9:30 a.m.; Morning Worship 
10:30 a.m.

OLDEN
OLDEN BAPTIST CHURCH
"  CRAIG RIIOTON, Pastor
; 653-2201

Olden, Texas 76466
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Worship 
10:50 a.m.; Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Worship 7:00 p.m.

LIGHTHOUSE CHURCH 
Rusty Frasier 

653-2144
Corner of East & North StrccLs In Olden 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Sunday Morning 
11:00 a.m.; Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night 7:00 p.m,

OLDEN CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Minister Roy Haley

Bible Gass 10:00 a.m.; Morning Worship 
10:30 a.m.; Evening Worship 5:00 p.m.

AREA
FLATWOOD CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Jim Hatcher 639-2549 
Morning classes 9:45 ajn.; Bible classes 9:45 
a.m.; Morning Worship 10:30 a.m.; Sunday 
Evening 5:00, Wednesday Evening 7:00.

KOKOMO BAPTIST CHURCH 
RL 1 Gorman 

Clarance Wilson
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Evening 7:00 p.m.

MANGUM BAPTIST 
Pastor David Sublctt 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Training Union 6:00 p.m.; 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.; Wednesday 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.

UNION CENTER BAPTIST CHURCH 
Charles E. (Red) Chamberlain 

5 miles north of Rising Star on Hwy. 183. 
Sunday School 10 a.m.; Worship Service 11 
a.m.; Wednesday Prayer Service 8 p.m,

CORINTH BAPTIST CHURCH 
Midway between Cisco and Eastland 

Exit North from Hwy. 80 
at Amphitheater 

Benny Hagan
Services Sunday 10.00 and 11:00 a.m.; 6:00 
and 7:00 p.m.; Wednesday 7:30 p.m.

GUNSIGHT BAPTIST CHURCH * 
P.O. Box 572 

Eastland
Pastor Rex Boggs

Sunday Services 10 a.m. and 11 a.m. Sunday 
and Wednesday 7 p.m.

HARMONY BAPTIST CHURCH 
Morton Valley 

O.L. Rodger, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Worship 
11:00 ajn.; Sunday evening 7:00 p.m.; Wed­
nesday evening worship 7:00 p.m.
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Little-Snapp
Miss LaDawn Ann 

L ittle and Mr. Stacy 
Wayne Snapp were united 
in marriage on Saturday 
June 1, 1991. The cere­
mony began a t three 
o’clock in the afternoon in 
the First Baptist Church 
of Ranger, Texas.

Parents of the bride are 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby L. 
L ittle of the Kokomo 
Community. The bride­
groom is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Gary Snapp of 
Lake Leon. Grandmoth­
ers of the bride are Mrs. 
Annie Rendall of Ranger, 
formerly of Cisco, and 
Mrs. Mamie Little of the 
Kokomo Community. 
G randparen ts of the 
groom are Mr. and Mrs. 
E. D. Grant of Nocona, 
Mrs. Emily Snapp of 
Nocona, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob McMillan of Mineral 
Wells.

The double ring cere­
mony was performed by 
Dr. Joseph McClain of 
Brownwood, pastor 
emeritis of First Baptist 
Church of Ranger.

Wedding music was 
provided by Mr. Tim Fails, 
cousin of the bride, from 
Arlington. Mr. Fails sang 
Ice Castles as the Moth­
ers and grandmothers 
were seated. During the 
ceremony Miss Gayla 
Maxwell, cousin of the 
bride, joined Mr. Fails in 
singing a duet “Love Can 
Build a Bridge.”

The candles were lit by 
Miss Emily L ittle  of 
Eastland and Mr. Cody 
Fails of Arlington. Emily 
wore a tea length dress of 
royal blue satin trimmed 
in white lace, Cody wore a 
black suit with a royal 
blue cumberbun and bow 
tie.

Given in marriage by 
her father the bride wore 
a white satin gown with a 
V neckline, leg of mutton 
sleeves, basque waist, and 
a cathedral train. The 
exquisite bodice was cov­
ered with beaded and 
sequined lace. The leg of 
mutton sleeves were deco­
rated  with appliques, 
pearls, sequins and cov­
ered buttons. The bouf­
fant skirt flowed into a 
cathedral length train. 
The skirt was accented 
with appliques, cut outs, 
sequins, beads, chantilly 
lace and bugle beads. The 
back of the dress was 
accented by a large bow 
and the dress and train 
were edged witk Lyon 
lace. A finger length veil 
was accented with lace, 
sequins, and pearls to 
match the bride’s dress. 
The bridal bouquet was 
designed with a variety of 
white silk flowers and was 
accented with a touch of 
royal blue.

The groom was dressed 
in a white formal tuxedo 
with tails. He wore a white 
cumberbun and bow tie 
for the ceremony.

Best man was Mr. Ty 
Viehman, whois stationed 
in Penscola, Florida. 
Groomsmen were Brent 
Snapp, brother of the 
groom, of Stephenville, 
Bobby Strickland, brother 
of the groom, and Rowdy
Rollins, both of Eastland. 
Groomsmen and ushers 
wore black tuxedoes with 
royal blue cumberbuns 
and bow ties.

Maid of Honor was Mrs. 
Lara Arleen Barfield of 
Tyler, sister of the bride. 
Bridesmaids were Mrs. 
Jenny Mayberry of Tolar, 
Miss Kari Schyler of Cisco, 
and Miss Gayla Maxwell 
of Cleburne, cousin of the 
bride. Attendants wore
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C isco ,T ex a s  
(817) 442-2161

89 Hyundia, 5 speed, air, 1 
owner, new tires.........$3650

88 Chevy Celebrity, auto, 
air, cruise, AM/FM, 1 owner, 
nice car.......................... $3995

88 Yugo, 1 owner, air, 
stereo, 39,000 m iles, 
nice car.......................... $1595

83 Olds. D elta 88 Royale, 
B rougham , 4 door, fu lly  
loaded............................ $2550

86 Escort, 5 sp., air, 
60,000 act. miles, 
nice car....................... $1995

88 Escort EXP, 
low m iles.......... $4395

85 LTD, 4 door, air, 
autom atic...................... $2250

85 GMC S ie r r a  C la ss ic  
Pickup, fully loaded, auto, 
air, nice truck............. $4350

88 Ford Tempo, 2 door, auto, 
air, cruise, extra nice car, 
52,000 m iles...................$4350

85 Ford Tempo, 2 door, auto, 
a ir , c r u is e ,  g o o d  w ork  
car..................................... $1795

80 C h ev y  V an , C a p ta in  
chairs, loaded................$3500

87 Ford, 4 door, 
Taurus................. $4550

89 Chevy Cavalier 
Wagon...............................$4995

89 Ford Tempo, 4 door, auto  
and air, 60,000 actual m iles, 1 
owner, extra n ice .........$4950

89 M ercury Topaz, 4 door,
auto & air, extra nice, new  
tires, 52,000 m iles.........$4950

90 Ford Festiva LX, 5 sp., w/
air, 31,000 m iles , AM/FM, 
stereo, 1 ow ner...............$3995

89 Subaru, 2 door, auto  
w/air, extra nice,
1 ow ner car..................... $3750

85 Ford Pickup F150, auto & 
air...................................... $3750

Lake Cabin South Side Lake Cisco. 
Other Cars To Choose From.
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tea length dresses of royal 
blue satin, featuring a 
sweetheart neckline. The 
bodice was covered with 
royal blue lace and the 
sleeves were accented 
with bows and lace. They 
wore blue and white flow­
ers accented with pearls 
in their hair. They car­
ried white satin  fans 
trimmed in sequins, blue 
lace, pearls, flowers, rib­
bon and lace streamers.

The flower girl was Miss 
Ashley Williams of Breck- 
enridge, niece of the 
groom. She wore a tea 
length royal blue satin 
dress with white colar and 
lace and matched the 
candle lighter.

Ringbearers were An­
drew and Jo h a th an  
Barfield of Tyler, neph­
ews of the bride. Th^y 
wore m atching white 
linen suits with a royal 
blue pinstripes, royal blue 
bow ties and cumberbun s. 
They carried white lace 
pillows.

U shers were Dean 
Strickland, brother of the 
groom, and Scott Brin­
kley, both of Eastland.

The reception was held 
in the fellowship hall. In 
keeping with the bride’s 
chosen theme of fans and 
candles the colors of royal 
blue and white was car­
ried throughout the fel­
lowship hall. The bride’s 
table was covered with a 
white lace tablecloth and 
featured a hugh white 
cake cake with touches of 
royal blue. The fountain 
and stairways led to dif­
ferent levels of the cake. 
The cake was baked and 
designed by Miss Kim 
Williams, sister of the 
groom, as a gift to the 
newlyweds. The groom’s 
table was covered with a 
blue lace table cloth and 
featured a German Choco­
late groom’s cake. An ice 
scupture was featured on 
the third table. The sculp­
ture was filled with fresh 
fruit and surrounded by 
fresh vegetables, dips, and 
finger food.

Members of the house 
party  were Mrs. Kim 
Williams of Breckenridge, 
sister of the groom, who 
catered the reception, 
Miss Shelby Snapp of 
Eastland, sister of the 
groom, Mrs. Angie Snapp 
of Stephenville, sister-in- 
law of the groom, Miss 
Sissy Humphrey of Car­
bon and Mrs. Mindy Grif­
fin, Mrs. Tracy Driskill 
and Miss Christy Ed­
wards, all of Ranger.

LaDawn is a 1989 
graduate of Ranger High 
School. She attended  
Cisco Jun io r College, 
transfering to Tarleton 
State University at mid­
term last year where she 
will continue her studies 
in the fall. She is employed 
by the House of Webster 
Gift Shop in Eastland. 
Stacy is a graduate of 
Eastland High School and 
Texas State Technical 
Institute in Waco. He is 
employed by Aquila 
Equipment Company in 
Eastland.

Family and friends at- 
tendingthe weddingfrom 
Abilene, A rlington, 
Austin, Benjamin, Breck­
enridge, Brownwood, 
Cisco, Cleburne, Clyde, 
Eastland, Gorman, Hous­
ton, Midland, Mineral 
Wells, Nocona, Paris,

Gaines Automotive
H i Tech C a re  F o r  H i Tech C a rs

Air Conditioning Service 
Engine Cooling System 
Brakes
Hydraulic & Mechanical 

Clutch

Engine Analysis 
Fuel Injection 
Carburetion 
Computer Control

State Inspection Station
314 W. Main Eastland 629-1008
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Laird-Alien

H ill-Stephens

Betsy Ann Laird of Cisco 
and Leslie Darryl Allen of 
Scranton were united in 
marriage in a ceremony

i
performed at three o’clock 
on the afternoon of Sun­
day, June 9, 1991, in Cal­
vary Baptist Church in 
Cisco. Rev. Ronnie Shack­
elford, pastor, performed 
the ceremony.

The bride is the daugh­
te r of W illiam and 
Dorothy Laird of Cisco. 
Parents of thebridegroom 
are Bobby and Sue Allen 
of Scranton.

Given in marrige by hei• 
father, the bride wore 
Rocky Mountain white 
jean and white shirt, car­
rying out the wedding’s 
western theme. She car­
ried a weddingbouquet of 
white and blue flowers, 
made by her uncle James 
Laird.

The bride and bride­
groom wore m atching 
sh irts , made by the 
bridegroom’s mother. She 
also made the shirts worn

Stephenville, Tyler, And 
Whitehouse, Texas Out of 
state visitors were Mr. Ty 
Viehm an, and of 
Pensacola, Florida and 
Miss Amy McDonald of 
Washington D.C.

After a wedding trip to 
San Antonio, the newly­
weds are a t home in 
Eastland.

by the matron of honor 
and bridesmaids.

The decorations, blue 
and white flowers with 
brass candle sticks, were 
made by Carolyn and 
James Laird. The music 
was western songs.

Maid of honor was 
Tammy Sue Laird Harris 
of Scranton, sister ofbride. 
B ridesm aids were 
Melissa Betteas and Ber­
nice White, both of Cisco. 
Bridal attendants wore 
Rocky M ountain blue 
jeans with cream colored 
sh irts  with tiny blue 
horseshoes on them.

Best man was Philip 
Keith Allen of Scranton, 
brother of bridegroom. 
Ushers were James Laird 
of Cisco, uncle of bride, 
and Robert H arris of 
Scranton, brother-in-law

Corena Hill and Bill 
Stephens were married at 
6 p.m. Friday, June 28, 
1991, a t the home of Rev. 
and Mrs. David Sublett. 
Rev. Sublett, pastor of 
Mangum Baptist Church, 
performed the ceremony.

Mrs. David Sublett was 
the pianist.

ofbride.
Guests were registered 

by Sammi Solis. Cake and 
punch were served by 
Becky Webb and Carolin 
Laird.

A reception was hosted 
by the brides parents in 
the fellowship hall of the 
church. The weddingcake 
was made by Marie Starr, 
and the bridegroom’s cake 
was made by the his 
mother.

The bride is the grand­
daughter of Mrs. Willie 
Fay Laird.

The couple is living in 
Arlington.

The bride is the daugh­
ter of Mrs. Alan Gorham 
of Cisco and W.A Prichard 
of Carlsbad, N.M.

The attendants were 
Clay and Audry Millican 
of Carbon.

A reception followed the 
wedding ceremony.

The bride is a graduate 
of Cisco Junior College.

The bridegroom is em­
ployed as a foreman at 
EBAA Iron.

The couple will make 
their home in Eastland.

Hogan-W hitley 
To Wed Ju ly  6

J.R. Hogan and Anita 
W hitley request the 
honour of your presence 
at their wedding Satur­
day, July 6, at 2 p.m. at 
the Women’s Club, 103 
W est Plum m er in 
Eastland. Areception will 
follow.

All relatives and friends 
are invited to attend.

L ock es C elebrate  
50th A n n iversary  
W ith R ecep tion

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Locke 
of Lake Leon were hon­
ored Sunday afternoon, 
June 23rd, on the occa­
sion of their golden wed­
ding anniversary. The 
Lockes were married June 
20, 1941, in Comanche. 
The celebration was held 
in the Fellowship Hall of 
the First United Method­
ist Church in Eastland.

In a ttendance were 
their daughter, Nancy 
Locke Cox and husband, 
Kenneth, their children, 
Vicky Lynn of Arlington 
and Darlene Cox Jensen 
and Randy of Long Beach, 
California, also Muriel 
Locke Nelson and hus­
band, Karl and children, 
Sarah, Gale and Dana of 
Santa Fe, New Mexico.

Two hundred guests 
attended from Texas, New 
Mexico, California, Okla­
homa and Arkansas.
E d  W e n d e s  T o  
C e le b r a t e  5 0 th  
A n n iv e r s a r y

Friends and relatives 
are reminded ofthegolden 
wedding anniversary re­
ception for Ed and Irene 
Wende on Saturday, June 
29, from 5:00 to 8:00 p.m. 
at the Cisco Country Club.

At 5:30 p.m., the 
Wende’s son, Rev. David 
Wende, will conduct a 
brief ceremony for the 
renewal of the vows.

Everyone is invited to 
attend.
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ENJOY BETTER HEARING
$ 3 9 9 .

THERE IS 
NO

REASON 
TO WAIT 

ANY
LONGER! BEST LABS® WOO EL *S- 

fOO LOST ULD TO UDOCBtTt LOSS®

DESIGNED FOR 
THOSE THAT 

HEAR BUT 
DO NOT 

UNDERSTAND 
SOME WORDS

CUSTOMIZED 
FOR YOUR 
HEARING 
NEEDS.

5 56

COUPON

HEARING AID 
BATTER IES

$2.99
UOST POPULAR SIZES

PO« YOUR FREE HEATING TEST

Call 817-442-2168 
Clinton Hearing Center 
721 Conrad Hilton Ave. 

Cisco, Texas

COUPON

! HEARING AID 
i REPAIRS

: $89
I MOST MOOLIS

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I
L

2-8x1 Os, 3 -5x7s*
15 W allets an d  

32  M ini-Portraits
on your cho ice  o f a trad itional, 

nursery, sp ring  or fall backg round

mi
1 B] m m mmm

b b b

B
B

B
B

B
B

B
B

Bring in any lower-priced advertised offer and we'll match it!

S I  
IB

W e w e lco m e  e ve ryo n e  b a b e s  ch ild re n  adu lts  and  fam ily  g ro u p s  N o a p p o in tm e n t is ever 
ne ce ssa ry  S a tis fa c tio n  g u a ra n te e d  P o s e s  o u r  s e le c t io n . W h ite  a n d  B la c k  B a c k g r o u n d *  D o u b le  

E x p o s u re  a n d  o th e r  S p e c ia l E ffe c ts  P o r t ra its  n o t a v a ila b le  in  a d v e r t is e d  p a c k a g e . L im it  o n a  
s p e c ia l p a c k a g e  p e r s u b je c t .  $2 for each  ad d itio n a l p e rso n  m po rtra it 

M ino rs  m ust be a cco m p a n ie d  by an ad u lt ‘ ap p ro x im a te  size

Stud*o H ours: Datiy 10 a m  unW one hour poor to  store d o sm g  
S unday (w nere open) store open  ng untd one  hour poor to  sto re  ctos*>g

WAL-MART
cPictureland cPortraitĜ tudio

5 Days Only!
W ednesday, July 3 through Sunday, July 7

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
i
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‘f a r m s S i n d  g a r d e n s ]
By David Tunm ire J

HOT WEATHER 
mm STRESSING 

TREES
Trees th roughou t 

Eastland County are be­
ginning to show signs of 
stress. This is the result 
of the dry late winter and 
early spring, then extreme 
wetconditions of late May 
and early June combined 
with the extremely hot 
conditions now. This 
combination of conditions 
is resulting in trees devel­
oping moisture and heat 
stress. Leaf scorching is 
the first sign of this stress 
people will notice.

The most typical signs 
of these types of stress in 
trees is the browning and

dryingup of the leaf edges. 
As the condition worsens, 
the drying area on the leaf 
will increase until almost 
the whole leaf is dead. I 
have seen these symptoms 
on red oak and pecan 
trees. Many trees like the 
cottonwood, will have 
leaves tumingyellow and 
drop off like it does in the 
fall.

M oisture stress and 
heat stress can be reduced 
by periodically watering 
to a depth of 6 to 8 inches. 
This can be accomplished 
by slow application of 
water along the drip line 
of the tree.

A soaker hose or drip 
irrigation system are the

^Nutrition Program !)
You can do a lot for 

yourselfbyhavingroutine 
examinations that would 
entail a good physical 
review. These reviews can 
detect problem s th a t 
might cause trouble in 
latermonthsoryears. For 
instance, a periodic review 
of your blood pressure 
(your senior center pro­
vides this service); ask 
your doctor to review all 
of your medications, per­
haps you are taking too 
much medicine; a routine 
review of you vaccination 
for pneumonia and influ­
enza (this should be done 
for all people over 50years 
of age); and assessment of 
your diet and nutritional 
status; and a feasibility 
study of controls on ciga­
rette purchasing, similar 
to those that exist for the 
sale of alcohol.

Many of these reviews 
are available through the 
Senior Centers. Why not 
plan to attend your center 
by calling today, Cisco: 
442-1557 or Eastland 629- 
1382.

Cisco programs for the 
week were: Those having 
birthdays and anniversa­
ries, in June, were hon­
ored. A special birthday 
celebration was held for 
Louella Carmichael on 
her 98th birthday. Din­
ner music by Lois Holder, 
M artha Shirey, Senior 
Center Band and Choir 
entertained. Blood Pres­
sure was taken by Mable 
Thetford and the Out­
reach Health Service held 
a blood pressure Clinic.

E astland  program s 
were: Dinner music by La 
Rue B roussard, Ruth 
Kendrick and the Senior 
Center Choir. Blood pres­
sure clinic by conducted 

O utreach Home

most effective methods of 
applying water around a 
tree. Using a hose tumeo 
on at a very low pressure 
will also work, but will 
require more time to wa­
ter all the way around the 
tree.

The key to reducing 
moisture stress and heat 
stress is applying the 
water slow enough for 
penetration into the root 
zone.

Generally a good water­
ing once every two weeks 
should be enough water if 
there is no rain. As a rule 
of thumb, continue your 
watering program if you 
don’t receive at least one 
inch of rain. Remember a 
hard, fast one inch rain 
may not all be absorbed 
into the Soil.

Do not over water. This 
is expensive and can 
compound the tre e ’s 
stress.

Each species of trees is 
different so keep that in 
mind. Some species of 
trees are more drought 
tolerant than the cotton­
wood or fruitless mul­
berry.

Kokomo News
By Zelda Jordan

Eastland County Bass Club

Health.
Menus for the week:
Monday—Ham, deviled 

eggs, green beans, sweet 
potatoes and apples, 
lemon ref. dessert, 
cornbread, bu tter and 
milk.

W ednesday— Swiss 
steak, squash, potatoes, 
tossed salad with ched- 
dar cheese, peach cobbler, 
bread, butter and milk.

F riday— Beef stew, raw 
vegetable with shredded ——— — —
cheese, tapicoa pudding, Cisco Press - Eastland Telegram -Ranger
cornbread, bu tter and ’ Times - Sunday, June 30, 1991
milk.

Lewallen Family 
Reunion In Lub­

bock
Arvel and Etta Lewal­

len were hosts for the 
annual reunion of the 
family of the late Jim and 
Lois Lewallen at their 
home in Lubbock on Sat­
urday, June 22.

Barbecue brisket and 
chicken and all the trim­
mings along with a boun­
tiful supply of delicious 
desserts was enjoyed.

Those present to enjoy 
the delicious food, visit- 
ingand the takingofmany 
pictures for family albums 
were Glenn and Zelda 
Jordan of Kokomo, Arvel 
and E tta  Lewallen of 
Lubbock, Laveme Winn 
of Muleshoe, Bo and Bar­
bara Bell of Denver City, 
Glenda and Sheri Miles 
and Bill Priest of Abilene, 
Ted and Cindy Jordan, 
Kyle and Kayla of Por- 
ta les, N.M., Jim  and 
Kathy Winn, Maeghan 
and Justin of Lubbock, 
Sam and Audree Tipton 
of Lubbock, Debra, Matt, 
Chase and Kasey Taylor 
of the Colony, Clarence 
and Carol Milam, Errin 
and Allie of Lubbock, 
Rhonda Slover, April and

r V •

THIS SEASON’S MVP

.......... • —v,V •
' t i f f /

Certified GM 
Technician 
Provide Quality 
Brake and 
Shock Service 
With One-Stop 
Shopping And 
Competitive 
Prices.

Always Insist 
On The
Genuine Thing: 
GM Brakes 
And Shocks

SEE US TODAY! 
ON ALL MAKES

rGREAT
SERVICE
BEGINS

JIM CALDWELL 
MOTORS

Highway 80 E 
Eastland - 817-629-2636

Factory Authorized Service 
From Certified Mechanics 
Who Take Pride In Pleasing 
Their Customers.

GM QUALITY 
SERVICE PARTS GM

GENERAL MOTORS PARTS

Olds - Cadillac - Pontiac  -  Buick - GMC

BUILDERS
Building & Remodeling

ROOFING 
SIDING
METAL BUILDINGS 
PLUMBING 
ELECTRICAL 

CONCRETE
*

#•

Commercial * Residential 
Jerry Maston • Owner 629-8148

John of Lubbock, Neil 
Slover, James and Zane 
of Colorado City, Steve 
and Lanette Leasure, 
Brandon and Bryce of 
Hereford.

Also Bob and Floy Le­
wallen of Odessa, Wayne 
Taylor of Muleshoe, and 
Ronda Wilcox, Cody, 
DeAndra and Nicky of 
Idalou.

A wonderful time was 
had by all.

Nancy Hendricks and 
Rosa Aguilar of Eastland 
visited in Clyde on Thurs­
day with Sylvia, Roy and 
Yancy Buchanan.

Recent visitors with 
Bro. Joe O’Neal were Rev.

JOHNSON WINS

Dwayne Clower of Cisco, 
John Taylor of Eastland, 
J. L. Rankin of Brecken- 
ridge, Rex Boggs of Rising 
Star and Shawn Ellis of 
Sipe Springs.

Troy Scitern was a visi­
tor with the Glenn Jor­
dans on Tuesday evening.

The 5th Sunday night 
singing will be held at the 
New Hope Baptist Church 
on Sunday night, June 30. 
The Kokomo BA ptist 
Church will dismiss Sun­
day night services and 
attend the singing.

Bro. Jim  Gilispie of 
Stephenville will be the 
guest speaker a t the 
Kokomo Baptist Church 
Sunday morning June 30.

AT LEON
The weekly jackpot 

sponsoredby the Eastland 
County Bass Club held on 
Wednesday, June 26, was 
won by Jimmy Johnson. 
Jimmy had three fish 
weighing a total of 7.58 
pounds. In second place 
with two fish weighing 
4.52 pounds was Terry 
Wilson. There was a total 
of 20 anglers who fished 
this weekly jackpot. The 
next jackpot will be 
Wednesday, July 3.

The next monthly club 
meeting has been moved 
to July 11 instead of July 
4 due to the holiday. All 
members are urged to be 
inattendancebecause the 
nom inating committee 
will present their nomi­
nations for the offices that

will be coming open in 
September.

The nextscheduled club 
tournam ent will be on 
Saturday, July 13. Club 
members will meet a t 
Double Vision Restaurant 
for the drawingofthe lake 
to be fished. This drawing 
will take place at 6 a.m. 
Fishing hours will then 
be set.

they
w on’t

m ix.

T
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20% MORE FREE 
D A VID 'S
SUNFLOWER 
SEEDS

Over
0 0 0  Chances to win CASH,

FREE PRODUCTS & FREE FOOD —

8.1 OZ. 
PKG.

M  &  M 's . STARBURST  
OR SKITTLES

ALL VARIETIES  
RICH'S

DONUTS
M IX  OR M A TC H

MARS
CANDIES

REG.
55c

PENNY SM A R T  
BATHRO O M
TISSUE

4 ROLL PKG.

79c
ALLSUP'S
FA M O U S

BURRIT0S

FOR

N T O M 'S  CORN OR 
TORTILLA
SNACKS

REGULAR $1.29 SIZE

BREAKFAST ON THE RUN

SAUSAGE, EGG & BISCUITS ..EACH 79c
OLD FASHION

CREME WAFERS Z F0R

Shurfine
Charcoal

10 lb.

$1.99

Baird, Cisco, 
Eastland, 
Ranger

Hunt's
B-B-Q
Sauce
18 oz.

990
PRICES EFFECTIVE JUNE 29-JULY 6 ,1991

$1,000°° WINNER:
WILLIAM HATCHER, ROSWELL N.M. 

$100°° WINNERS:
GERALD GAULT, CLOVIS, N.M.

RICKI GARCIA. LOVINGTON, N.M. 
SCOTTIE ROBERTSON, SEYMOUR. TEXAS 

CANDACE TAYLOR, NOCONA. TEXAS 
ELLEN CONTRERAS. KERMIT, TEXAS 

WAYNE CRUMP, SANTA FE, N.M. 
JEWELLA PAINTER. RUIDOSO. N.M. 
TRACY CAPITAN, SANTA FE. N.M.

GAS FOR A YEAR:
ROCKY SMITH. PADUCAH, TEXAS

Enter Our Second Chance Sweepstakes and

Cruise The Caribbean
OR Be one of 9 lucky people 

who w ill win
FREE GAS 

FOR A YEAR*!
(*8 Gallons a week for 52 weeks)

7 Day Cruise For Two Can
Be Yoursfo ssooo w«e)With 
$300 Spending Money!

NO PURCHASE NECESSARY 
See Store For Complete Rules 

And Odds
fW I 91
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Volume 1991- 
Twenty Six: 30 June 1991

. . . FLORIDA BIBLE 
RECORDS ARE
SOUGHT. Bible records 
are being gathered by the 
Florida State Genealogi­
cal Society from families 
with a Florida Connec­
tion. The Society hopes to 
publish these records in 
book form so that they will 
be available to all inter­
ested persons.

Photocopies are needed 
-PLEASE DO NOTSEND 
ORIGINALS. If the cop­
ies are hard to read, please 
attach a typed transcript. 
Contributors will be given 
full credit and all records 
received will be acknowl­
edged.

Send copies of ALL 
BIBLE RECORDS. Old & 
Current to - Mrs. Anne 
Taylor; 2055 South Floral 
Ave. #19; Bartow, FL. 
33830.

*  *  *

REGISTER FAMILY 
ASSOCIATION NEWS, 
Editor: Cherie Register, 
Rt. 4, Box 818, Palatka, 
Florida 32177.

Printed once a year, this 
publication is an excellent 
choice for anyone with a 
REGISTER connection. 
Includesminutesfrom the 
previous year’s REGIS­
TER REUNION, Board of 
Directors M eeting, 
Awards, Photos, An­
nouncements, Memorials, 
Inquiries, H isto rian’s 
Report and much more! 
So much packed into the 
24 pages and all for only 
$5.00.

The following inquiry 
was listed in the 1991 
Edition of the Register 
Family Association News:

1 am interested in ob­
taining pictures (or cop­
ies) of MRS. MAYSIE 
MILES REGISTER. She 
was born 13 August 1900 
and died 1 November 
1930. Maysie was the 
daughter of David Patrick 
and M issouri Deen 
MILES of Appling 
County, Georgia.

Maysie was the wife of 
John Henry REGISTER 
of Seville, Florida. She 
was the mother of Tho­
mas, Cliflon and William 
REGISTER.

If you have any infor­
mation please contact 
WILLIAM B. REGISTER; 
623 Pineland Trail; 
Ormond Beach, FL. 
32174. Phone 904-676- 
0163._________________

. . .  NEWS RELEASE!! 
The folio wing information 
has been received from 
Clearfield Company:

Clearfield Company is 
delighted to announce a 
new publication which, ' 
word for word, may be the 
best book on genealogical 
research in Ireland ever 
written—Brian Mitchell’s 
POCKET GUIDE TO 
IRISH GENEALOGY.

By skillfully blending 
case stud ies, maps, 
charts, and his own mas- 
tery of the subject, Mitch­
ell has managed to con­
vey the basics of Irish 
genealogical research in 
scarcely sixty pages. Fol­
lowing introductory chap­
ters on the background to 
research on the American 
side, the author describes 
the nature and uses of all 
significant record sources 
in Ireland, including but 
not limited to: civil and 
parish registers, grave­
stone inscriptions, wills, 
the Griffith’s Valuation, 
Tithe Books, the 1901 and 
1911 censuses, newspa­
pers, hearth money rolls, 
the registry of deeds, es­
tate records, and ordi­
nance survey memoirs. „ 
Another important chap­
ter explains the differ­
ences between the vari­
ous administrative divi­
sions of Ireland, knowl­
edge of which is critical in 
tracking down all avail­
able records on Irish an­
cestors. The POCKET 
GUIDE concludes with 
lists of all major Irish 
record offices and heritage 
centers, providing ad­
dresses and phone num­
bers, hours of operation, 
contact persons, and ma­
jor record holdings.

In short, if you need a 
handy roadmap to genea­
logical research in Ire­
land, look no further.

POCKET GUIDE TO 
IRISH GENEALOGY: 72 
pp., 7 X 10 maps, paper­
back. $9.95 plus $2.50 
shipping. ISBN # 0-8063- 
1300-5. Maryland resi­
dents add 5% sales tax; 
Michigan residents add 
4% sales tax. Clearfield 
Company, Inc.; 200 E. 
Eager Street; Baltimore, 
Maryland 21202.

* * *

R a n g e r  T im es  
Sunday, 

June 30, 1991

Ritchey Motor 
Company

Hwy. 80 West - Ranger 
‘ 817-647-3502

1984 Chevy Scottsdale P/U auto, 
air, stereo,power locks & windows,
oneowner....................................$2950.00
1987 Chevy Silverado P/U auto, air, 
stereo, power locks & windows
real nice truck.......................... $4250.00
1986 Chevy Celebrity 4 dr., auto, air
stereo..........................................$3550.00
1986 Ford Ranger P/U V8, auto, air,
stereo, red & white..................$3650.00
1979 Chevy Silverado P/U auto, air,
stereo, one of kind..................$2850.00
1983 Chevy Chevette auto, stereo, low
miles............................................$850.00
1983 Chevy Caprice 4 dr., auto, air, 
stereo, real clean car................$1950.00
1983 Olds Royale Brougham 4 dr.,
auto, air, stereo, tilt, cruise, power 
locks & windows, one owner, see to 
appreciate..................................$2950.00
1984 Chevy Camaro, auto, air, stereo,
as is............................................$2150.00

Come By And Visit
KR104

Points To Ponder
by Bill Reed, Pastor

The other evening I was 
watching a classic west­
ern movie on the Ameri­
can movie channel. The 
movie was the “Ox Bow 
Incident” It involved a 
mob who hanged three 
men for a murder that 
they thought the three 
men had committed. Sev­
eral people went with the 
mob hoping to prevent 
what happened. One of 
these was a black lay 
preacher. After the hang­
ing of the men the black 
man knelt in the dirt 
prayed and sang a spiri­
tual hymn.

For some reason the 
next day I was humming 
or singing spirituals un­
der my breath. Spirituals 
like “Swing low sweet 
chariot, comin’for to carry 
mehome.”Spirituals were 
born in the period of slav­
ery and was an expres­
sion that there would be 
better time after the mis­
ery of the slaves earthly 
life was over.

The theme in the spiri­
tuals were theologically 
correct because Jesus did 
say in His Sermon on the 
Mount that those who 
suffered insultand perse­
cution for His sake are 
“blest.” The concept of a 
reward in heaven was a 
new element introduced 
by Jesus. For Him there 
wasnothingmore certain. 
He said, “In my Father’s 
house their are many 
mansions,” or in some 
tran sla tio n s , “many 
rooms.” (John 14:2) It 
seems to reflect a “pie in 
the sky when you die” 
concept of Christianity.

Was this what Jesus 
meant when He spoke of 
“a rich reward in heaven?” 
Was He offering induce­
ment to good behavior, 
generous acts, works of 
charity, accept everything 
that happens with a stiff 
upper lip by holding out 
the promise of compensa­
tions in the after life? 
Conversely was He

threatening punishment 
beyond death for failure 
to live a good life?

When He spoke of the 
“rich reward in heaven” it 
was not in the sense of 
m aterial rew ard. But 
there is, and there must 
be a reward for a life of 
good works, otherwise 
C hristian ity  wouldn’t 
make any sense. The 
reward is, however not to 
be measured in commer­
cial terms but in term- of 
inner satisfaction, peace 
of mind and a clear con­
science. This kind of re­
ward is more real and 
enduring than any finan­
cial gain. There is noth­
ing wrong in looking for 
thatkindof reward. Ifthis 
is God’s world, and I be­
lieve it is. Any action 
which is in harmony with 
God’s will is therefore 
bound to be rewarded.

I would suggest that we 
here in Ranger start doing 
things not for what we 
can get out of it materi­
ally, but because it is the 
right thing to do. I would 
also suggest thatyou take 
your family to church this 
Sunday and you will find 
the rich reward of wor­
ship.

THE BIG 
FIVE-0

S?? - tK• . .4. ?

ttfappy ‘Birthday

JA C K IE  
D A N IE L S

ER52

Subscriptions
Make

Excellent
Gifts

Phone Today: 647-1101

. . . Send quicries and 
notices; books and other 
material for review to 
PilgrimsTo Pioneers; P.O. 
Box99;Ranger,TX76470 •

H A y C B E S
RODEO QUEEN 

CONTESTANT FORM
NAME:

AGE:

PARENTS:

SPONSOR:

RODEO QUEEN:
Entry Fee: $25.00 

Age: 14 thru 19 
For More Information 

Call Gloria Castro 647-1144 or 
647-3407 after 6:00 p.m. 

’’Deadline to enter July 8th" 
(Along with picture)

Mail to: Ranger Jaycecs 
P.O. Box 41 

Ranger, Texas 76470

Lawn Mowing Service 
Mowing, Bagging & 

Trimming 
Free Estimates 
Call 647-3418 ...

DANGEROUS WORKS
HOUSTON—(JU N E 

18, 1991)—Fireworks in­
jure nearly 10,000 people 
every year. A physician at 
Baylor College of Medi­
cine in Houston says sta­
tistics show that many of 
these injuries are prevent­
able.

“Most injuries from fire­
works occur in teenage 
and pre-ten boys,” said Dr. 
M. Bowes Hamill, assis­
tant professor of ophthal­
mology at Baylor. “The 
injuries we most often see,
to the hands and eves, can « *
be prevented by proper, 
adult supervision.”

Children frequently  
throw firecrackers at each 
other, causing injury as 
severe as blindness or 
deafness when they ex­
plode in midair near the 
head. Injuries to the hand 
and face occur when fire­
works with short fuses go 
off while they are still 
being held.

“I recommend that par­
ents take their children to 
organized firew orks 
shows, but if they do pur­
chase fireworks, it is im­
portant to know how to 
use them safely and prop­
erly,” Hamill said.

— Never allow fire­
works to be used without 
adult supervision.

— Never use fire­
works in prohibited areas.

— Always place fire­
crackers on the ground be­
fore lighting them.

— Never throw fire­
crackers,

— Rocket-like fire­
works should be launched 
from the ground, not the 
hand, and pointed away 
from people.

— Select an open 
field away from buildings 
to launch fireworks.

— Carefully read 
the in struc tions and 
warnings on fireworks.

Hamill says anyone 
planning to use fireworks 
should know first aid

IT S  T H E  LAW !

SEATBELTS
Buckle Up 

for Sa fety!□
STATK FARM

I N S U R A N C E

F a r m

In su ran ce.
Jim Wortinan 
214 S. Seaman 

Eastland 
629-1096

S 1ATF TARM INSURANCE COMPANIES 
Home OM<CS Bloomington UIukxs

measures should injuries 
occur.

Minor burns, the most 
common injury, should be 
treated by running cold 
water over the site imme­
diately. Apply a cold wa­
ter compress until the 
pain subsides and cover 
with gauze or sim ilar 
material.

If the eye is injured, 
inspect the area for any 
foreign object on the eye­
ball or the eyelids. If it is 
embedded in the eye, if 
there is bleeding, if sight 
is diminished or the pupil 
is not round, attempt no 
treatment and take the 
patient to an emergency 
room immediately. Oth­
erwise, gently rinse the 
area with clean water 
until the object is re­
moved.

In the case of an explo­
sion neartheear, perfora­
tion of the eardrum is I J
possible. Cover the ear 
with a clean, dry pad to 
prevent infection and 
have a physician examine 
the area.

A first aid kit is recom­
mended for any outing in­
volving Fourth ofJuly fire­
works.

RANGER JAYCEE 
RANCH RODEO

Thursday, Ju ly  4th, 
Jaycee Rodeo Arena, 9 
A.M. & 7:30 P.M. Con­
testants Call: 639-2382 or 
639-2236. Events - Team 
Prnning, Double Mug­
ging, Team Roping Brand­
ing & Milking. Four Man 
Team Entry Fee $240.00.

CTAMI MEETING
The next meeting of the 

CTAMI (Central Texas 
Alliance for the Mentally 
111) is Tuesday, July 2, 
1991 at 7:00 p.m. at the 
F irs t B aptist Church, 
Brownwood. The speaker 
will be J. Don Wright, a 
therapist from Abilene.

they
w on’t

m ix.
your 

marketplace the

WANT ADS

Read The 
fCIassifieds

0 Mike Stone
817-647-1145

647-1333

M  & M  H O M E  & A P P L IA N C E
Service Company

A ir -C o n d il io n in g
H e a lin g In s ta lla tio n
R e f r ig e ra to rs S e rv ic e
W a s h e rs , D ry e rs R.H  RCPairS

In an effort to clean up and beau­
tify Lake Leon, the Eastland 
County Water Supply District 
would like to ask everyone with a 
boat dock in ill repair to please 
repair or remove the dock by July 
1, 1991. &40-43

&4*-Jl

Legal Notice

Ranger ISD is seeking 
bids for fleet fuel sand fleet 
supplies for the 1991-92 
school year. Interested 
bidders shouldcontactthe 
Business Office as listed 
above.

LEGAL-BID NOTICE
Ranger ISD is seeking 

bids for a driver educa­
tion car. Bid specifications 
and deadlines can be ob­
tained by w riting the 
Business Office at Route 
3 Bos 12D Ranger, TX 
76470, or by calling 647- 
1187.

LEGAL
Ranger ISD is seeking 

bids for all custodial sup­
plies, athletic supplies, 
andclassroom suppliesfor 
the next school year. In­
terested bidders should 
contact the Business Of­
fice as listed above.

LEGAL
Ranger ISD is seeking 

bids for milk supplies and 
bread supplies for the 
1991-92 school year. In­
terested bidders should 
contact the Business Of­
fice as listed above.

HOST FAMILIES
SOUGHT FOR
INTERNATIONAL 

HIGH SCHOOL 
STUDENTS

. . iv J •

Host families are being 
sought for high school 
exchange students from 
Sweden, Norway, Den­
mark, Finland, Holland, 
Switzerland, Germany, 
Spain, F rance, I ta ly , 
Yugoslavia, Czechoslova­
kia, Brazil, Ecuador, J a ­
pan and Australia for the 
SCHOOL YEAR 1991-92 
in a program sponsored 
by the American Intercul- 
tural Student Exchange 
(AISE).

The students, age 15 
through 17, will arrive in 
the U nited  S ta te s  in 
August 1991, attend a 
local high school, and re­
turn to their home coun­
tries in June 1992. Stu­
dents are fluent in Eng­
lish, have been screened 
by their school represen­
tatives in their home coun- 
tries , have spending 
money and medical insur­
ance.

Host families may de­
duct $50 per month for 
income tax purposes.

Families interested in 
host family program  
should call Toll Free: 1- 
800-SIBLING.

Drive safely. Don*l wreck \«»ur lilt

SAVE MONEY- CONTACT 
SOCIAL SECURITY
Curious about how 

much your Social Secu­
rity benefit will be when 
you retire? Need a Social 
Security number for your 
child? Changing your 
name because of marriage 
or divorce?

All you have to do is 
contact Social Security. 
There is no need to pay for 
these services. Many 
times people will get ad- 
vertisements from compa­
nies that offer to assist 
people in their dealings 
with Social Security—for 
a fee. But there’s abso­
lutely no reason to pay a 
middle man for services 
that Social Security offers 
for free.

A dvertisem ents for 
these companies sound as 
if they’re offering some 
special service that Social 
Security doesn’t provide, 
or that they have some 
secretinformation that we 
won’t tell people about. 
Some companies make it 
sound as if they can expe­
dite the service.

These claims are abso­
lutely false. In reality, the 
companies come to Social

Security to get the infor­
mation. They just act as a 
go-between, which adds 
an extra step to the proc­
ess, thus slowing it down.

So why do people pay 
for services they can get 
for free? There are a 
num ber of reasonw s. 
Some people ju st don’t 
realize that Social Secu­
rity offers the service. 
Others are leery of deaL 
ing with the bureaucracy 
so they are willing to pay 
for the “assistance” that 
they really don’t need. 
And sometimes, people 
get official looking mail­
ings and think they’re 
from Social Security.

How can avoid paying 
for a service Social Secu­
rity offers for free? If you 
need help with a Social 
Security question or prob­
lem, contact Social Secu­
rity directly. And you get 
an official-looking letter 
offering a Social Security 
service and requesting a 
payment, it’s probably 
from a private company. 
Contact Social Security 
for help before you re­
spond.

i l

We proudly present

A video presentation of 
a life remembered®
We are excited about this new service we now 
offer you. The Tribute Program is a tasteful and 
wonderful way to honor the life of a loved one.

Each Tribute Program is individually created 
from photos, music, scenery and a quotation 
you select. You choose the pictures that recall 
the treasured moments of your loved one's life. 
With lovely, moving background scenes, and 
the music that means the most to you, your 
Tribute Program is a truly beautiful way to 
preserve your cherished memories.

Call us or stop by for a free booklet about the 
Tribute Program. Find out how the Tribute Pro­
gram can help you remember all the love be­
tween the laughter and tears.

Bakker Funeral Home
411 S. Mulberry St. 

Eastland, Texas 
817-629-1726

The Tribe to VYofrtm is produced by K siksul M u ic WA m*o


