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Page Ripley, Freak 
Melon-Pomegranate

O. W. Stanley, resident o f the 
Ridge community, has brought 
to the County Agent’s office a 
"Believe It Or Not”  freak, a cross 
between a watermelon and a 
pomegranate. The melon Is 
divided equally, htUf Ls natural 
watermelon, dark green In color, 
while the other half 1s yellow. It 
Is about the size of a large grape­
fruit and weighs only 2 >4 pounds

Mr Stanley’s only explanation 
for the freak is that It grew 
close to a pomegranate, and he 
believes was crossed with It.

Seeds from the new melon will 
be planted and the resulting 
fruit watched carefully with the 
hope of producing an “ individual 
portion” watermelon.

------------ o------------

Convocation Program 
Was Success

The services held last Sunday 
night at the school auditorium, 
with Judge Oerald presiding, 
were splendid from every stand­
point.

A large crowd was present and 
listened to the inspiring and up­
lifting messages brought by the 
three ministers o f the town. El­
der Furr, Rev Dawson and Rev. 
Brucks.

’Their subjects were befitting 
the occasion and if the young 
people u  well as students will 
be guided by the advice and ad­
monition given, their lives will 
surely be enriched and more suc- 
ce.ssful as life goes on.

A delightful quartet was fur­
nished by Messrs. Buel Condon, 
F. p. Bowman. R. R  Clements 
and C. E. Baylry, accompanied 
at the piano by Miss Clara Bow­
man.

Supt. Smith made a short talk 
and then presented each teach­
er and as they graciously res­
ponded by rising from their 
seats, they were heartily ap­
plauded.

Rev. Dawson pronounced the 
benediction.

------ o ------------

Church o f Christ
Edgar E. Furr, Minister

Our fall work started o ff In a 
nice way with good crowds In 
attendance. We hope to make 
our work this fall as profitable 
as possible. Our Bible school 
begins each Lord’s Day morning 
at 9:4.5, with our regular hour of 
worship following the Bible 
school.

Our preaching service on Sun­
day nights will begin at 7:45 for 
awhile and as the days grow 
shorter will begin earlier.

The meeting last week at 
Ridge school house proved to be 
one of the best meetings In the 
county for the past season. 

-------------------o — --------------

Local C. o f C.
Held Meeting

The Chamber o f Commerce 
held a meeting Tuesday after­
noon and planned a number of 
Interesting things for entertain­
ment of the people who visit our 
town on Trades Day each month.

Be sure to watch the columns 
of The Ekigle and the slides at 
the Melba theatre for announce­
ment o f entertainment features.

Lions Club Hears 
Mrs. W. E. Cantrell

A welcome Innovation was 
sprung at the Lions Club meet­
ing In the Methodist Church re­
creation room Tuesday evening 
when Mrs W E Cantrell of Lo- 
meta was presented as the speak­
er of the evening.

Preceding the program a fried 
chicken dinner wa.s served.

The speaker was Introduced in 
big-league style. Raymond Lit­
tle, vice-president and acting 
chairman first called on Rev. 
Fred J. Brucks of the program 
committee who presented the 
committee chairman. Dr T. C. 
Graves, who Introduced Mr. Can­
trell who presented his wife, the 
speaker of the evening.

Mrs Cantrell, a former Oold- 
thwaite resident, prefaced her 
remarks with a fishing story 
which Is destined for wide circu­
lation In these parts and then 
discussed seriously and effective­
ly the significance of world 
trends today and the needs of 
America.

She gave a graphic picture of 
the Ills of Europe and contrasted 
them with the security of Ameri­
ca. Her address was greeted 
with much applause and a rising 
vote of thanks.

Coach S. E Clonlnger spoke 
briefly on football prospects for 
this year.

------------ o - ----------

County Court 
Has Quiet Session

County court convened Mon­
day and three cases were dis­
posed of. One was a lunacy case 
in which the person was found 
Insane. The defendant In a case 
of aggravated assault plead 
guilty and one charged with 
bootlegging wtks tried and given 
15 days In the county Jail. 

------------ o ------------

Four New Stamps 
To Be Issued Soon

Washington. — ’The Postoffice 
Department Intends to Issue four 
new postage stamps In October.

The stamps, latest In the 31- 
stamp presidential series. will 
bear likenesses of Presidents 
Franklin Pierce, James Buchan­
an, Abraham Lincoln and An­
drew Johnson.

Ranging In denomination from 
14 to 17 cents, respectively, they 
are scheduled to be Issued as 
follows: Pierce, October 6 ; Bu­
chanan, October 13; Lincoln. Oc­
tober 20, and Johnson, October 
27.

They will be on sale at the 
Ooldthwalte jjostofflce.

Library Notes
Last week was a banner week 

for the Ooldthwalte Public Li­
brary. Mrs. Chas McKenny 
presented a set o f Brittalnica 
Encyclopaedias which belonged 
to her father, the late A. J. Har­
rison, a lovely memorial In the 
town he loved and where he was 
loved and respected.

Little Miss Lenora Sykes o !  
Winters brought 13 Juvenile 
books for the library when she 
came to visit her grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Hudson.

Dorothy Nell Rudd also gave 
a girl’s book.

Band Concert 
Dates Changed

The band concert this week 
will be held on Thursday night 
ln.stead of Tuesday.

R. M. Edgar, the new band In­
structor In the Ooldthwalte 
Schools, has commenced his 
work and has already won the 
enthusiastic co-operation of the 
band. He is a good teacher as 
well as an excellent musician 
and will prove an asset to the 
school and community.

JUNIOR LEAGUE PROGR.4M

Subject—‘‘What Shall We
Take?”

Leader—Lanar Keese.
Song.
Offering.
Leaders talk.
Talks by the following; 
Obedience—Jim Bob Steen. 
Service—Lee Roy Bennlngfleld 
Prayer—Bonnie Fern Doggett. 
Bible — Buddie Stokes.—Re­

porter.
________ ---------------

S. E. PASS RECEIVES 
DEGREE FROM NTS’TC

New Oil Well 
Waits on Rig

with the slush pit and water 
well completed, the well that is 
being drilled for oil on the Ivy 
place north of Ooldthwalte Is 
waiting for the heavy rig to 
move on the Job. It Is expected 
at any time now, having been 
delayed In completing the well 
where it has been located.

Rural Electric 
Line May Extend

Increased interest In securing 
electric service In and around 
Center City this week has made [in Ooldthwalte that anyone can
It appear possible that the new 
high line may be exU'nded so &3 
to Include this section It will 
not be definitely known, how­
ever, until the total of applicants 
who have made their deposits 
has been tabulated.

------------ o------------

Anthrax Epidemic 
Less Serious Now

Livestock losses from anthrax 
are growing fewer and fewer 
and fears of a countywtde siege 
of the disease have proved 
groundless. Only one new out­
break has been reported since 
last week—this was on a farm 
in the Payne Oap community 
which has been put under qua­
rantine.

A part of north San Saba 
county has also been placed un­
der quarantine because of sev­
eral cases of anthrax there, but 
latest reports state that It ap­
pears to be under control.

First Cotton Bale 
Brings $26 Premium

Joe Corona who h w  frequently 
produced the first bale of cotton 
in Mills county in previous years 
repeated the performance this 
year on Friday, Sept. 2 J E 
Greathouse ginned the bale, and 
business men o f Ooldthwalte 
raised a $20.50 bonus for the 
grower. As the ginning was also 
donated, the total value of the 
premium amounted to $26.50.

The bale weighed 500 pmunds 
and was bought by Mr. Great- 
house at 8 cents.

This Is the latest that the first 
bale o f cotton has been ginned

Sidney Pass, son of Mr. and 
Mrs E. L. Pass, received his de­
gree In the summer class of the 
North Texas State Teachers Col­
lege at Denton, August 26.

Sidney has been teaching In 
the public schools o f Abilene for 
the past several years and has 
made an excellent record In hLi 
chosen profession.

Behind the Scenes in 
American Business

NEW YORK, Sept. 8 —BUS! 
NESS.—The key to tomorrow’s 
business may lie In last week’s 
headlines from foreign capitals 
While the majority of Americans 
spent the week with nothing 
more pressing than to clean up 
their work to get away for the 
51st observance of Labor Day 
week end, all Europe was tense 
as a new war scare gripped the 
continent. Hitler made an un­
expected tour of Inspection of 
Germany’s fortifications along 
the Rhine opposite France and 
Switzerland no doubt to show he 
meant business In backing de­
mands of the German minority 
In Czechoslovakia for territorial 
autonomy. Heavy fighting oc­
curred in China a.s the Japanese 
army renewed Its attacks in the 
Hankow area. Italy passed a de­
cree ordering all Jews who have 
taken up residence in the coun­
try since the world war to leave 
within six month, even those 
who have acquired citizenship. 
In Mexico City, President Car­
denas opened the Mexican Con­
gress with a denunciatory speech 
refusing demands of the United 
States for arbitration of pay­
ments for seized land, attack­
ing the position of this country 
as an attempt to Impose the will 
of the strong on the weak. Mean­
while. In America a fighting unit 
of the Navy wa.s assigned to pa­
trol the Atlantic ocean for the 
first time since 1932 when the 
Naval Scouting Force was trans­
ferred to the Pacific.

WASHING'TON —Officials here 
continue optimistic over the 
business outlook believing that 
more definite statistical evidence 
of the steady rise now going on 
in many lines will appear within 
a few weeks. Whether business 
can be lifted bodily Into consid­
erably higher sales volume brack 
ets before next year, however, 
depends pretty much on three 
factors, economists p>olnt out: 1. 
The buying response o f the pub­
lic to the 1939 model automo­
biles. 2. Expansion In the capi­
tal goods Industries, iron and 
steel, machinery, transportation 
equipment, nonferrous metals, 
lumber, stone, clay, glass, and 
the like. 3. The ability o f the 
textile Industry, now booming, to 
maintain this pace; obaerwra 
don’t overlook possibility that 
present business may represent 
merely stocking up In anticipa­
tion of the new wage-hour law 
as it did In anticipation of NRA

remember. In 1924, according to 
Mr. Greathouse, the first bale 
came In on September 1, but In 
other years August saw the first 
bale.

The cotton which produced the 
bale this year was planted by 
Corona In April Immediately af­
ter the freeze He only planted 
15 acres at this time and then 
waited until later to finish 
planting. However the earlier 
planting will produce all the cot­
ton he makes.

Many other cotton growers are 
bewailing late plantings, some as 
late as June, which are a total 
failure this year.

—— o------------

Several Schools 
Start Monday

In addition to the Ooldthwalte 
school, those at Star. Center 
City, Mt. Olive, Midway and 
Chapel Hill opened last Monday. 
A number of others will open 
next Monday.

The total enrollment at Oold­
thwalte Is now approximately 
ten per cent over last year which 
was the largest on record. 

------------ o------------

Cotton Price 
Adjustment

C ity  Council H ears  
M o rriso n  Electrical 
Survey R eport

COLLEGE STA’nO N .—Cotton 
price adjustment payments on 
the 1937 crop will be made on a 
maximum of 60 per cent of the 
1937 base cotton production of 
farms for which applications are 
submitted, according to word re­
ceived from the Washington 
headquarters by the state AAA 
office at Texas A&M College.

An appropriation of 130 mil­
lion dollars is available for these 
payments. Of this amount. 
Texas will receive approximately 
$37,013,000 It was learned. The 
average payment rate will be 2.89 
cents per p>ound.

While payments are applied to 
the eligible part o f a producer’s 
1937 base cotton production, re­
gardless o f whether or not he 
took part In the 1937 Agricultu­
ral Conservation Program, no 
payment will be made to a pro­
ducer who knowingly overplant­
ed his 1938 cotton acreage al­
lotment.

In case the amount of cotton 
produced In 1937 was less than 
60 per cent o f the base, payment 
will not be made on more than 
the amount actually produced, 
except In cases of crop failure 
from specified causes. The max­
imum payments rate applies to 
all eligible cotton produced in 
1937 and not sold by the produc­
er before September 10, 1937, 
and Includes cotton held by pro­
ducers or put under the 1937 
government loan.

The payment rate on eligible 
cotton sold before September 10, 
1937, will be the amount by 
which the average price of 7-8 
Inch middling cotton on 10 des­
ignated spot markets was below 
12 cents on the date o f sale, but 
not to exceed 3 cents per pound 
in any case.

In cases o f crop failure due to 
hall, drought, flood. Insect or 
fungus Infestation, a payment 
not to exceed 60 per cent of the 
farm’s 1937 base allotment will 
be made on the normal produc­
tion of the 1937 cotton acreage.

‘The amount of cotton eligible 
for payment on a farm will be 
divided among the 1937 produc­
ers in accordance with their 
share of the acreage planted to 
cotton la 1937.

Methodist Men 
Give Barbecue

Methodist men and boys, who 
came out last In the summer at­
tendance conte.st at the Method­
ist Sunday School, prepared and 
served a barbecue and delicious 
trimmings for the entire Sunday 
School last Friday evening. The 
affair was held on the church 
lawn and overflowed on to the 
■street, which was roped off for 
the evening.

Following the delicious meal of 
barbecued mutton, potato salad, 
pickles, bread, red lemonade, 
cake and pie, a humorous pro­
gram wàs "broadcast” In which 
the Adams of the contest took 
revenge on the wInning'Eves..

■ o------------

Home Demonstration 
W ork Underway

Sixty-seven women from 12 
communities of Mills county re- 
.sponded to the first county-wide 
home demonstration meeting, 
held In Ooldthwalte Monday a f­
ternoon, Sept. 15.

Interest was keen and ar­
rangements were made to hold 
meetings In each community for 
the purpose o f organizing com­
munity home demonstration 
clubs through which the Exten­
sion Ser'vlce functions. ‘To date 
home demonstration clubs have 
been organized In South Bennett 
and Mount Olive communities.

Representatives from Star, 
Mullni, South Bennett. Mt Olive, 
Ooldthwalte, Scallorn, Lake Mer­
ritt, Big Valley, Center City, 
Pleasant Grove, Center Point, 
Prairie and Trigger Mt., attended 
Monday’s meeting.

------------ 0------------
Y. W. A .

The Y. W. A. met Tuesday 
evening at 8:00 p. m. Each 
member brought canned goods 
to be taken to a needy family 
here In town. Religious songs 
were sung at the humble home 
of the family by Y. W. A. mem­
bers. prayer by Mrs. Moon and 
sentence prayers by the girls 
were said. Two Blb> stories 
were told by Thelma Henry and 
Aurlel Tullos.

The Y. W. A. met for a Bible 
study and business meeting 
TTiursday evening.

New Y .W. A. members were 
united with other members bv 
repeating In unison the Y. W. A. 
watchword found In Daniel 12:3

Jean Ooosby, president this 
year, was given a handkerchief 
shower of appreciation for her 
service. The chair was then 
turned over to Aurlel Tullos, 
newly-elected president for the 
coming year and up to January. 
1940.

The date, of the weekly meet­
ings was changed to Tuesday 
instead of Thur.sday.—Reporter.

S. E. Q .^ j^ b
The club met with Mrs. Dan 

Callaway. After taking our va­
cation we are back at work. Mrs 
Callaway had In a quilt, so we 
quilted and talked as we hadn't 
been together In sometime.

There were seven present. Mrs.j 
Mohler Simpson was our guest 
We missed those who were ab­
sent.

Our meeting days are first and 
third Tuesdays In each month 
We meet with Mrs. Langlltz next 
time.

Mrs. Callaway served delicious 
cocoanut cake and punch which 
was very refreshing.—Reporter.

------------ o-------------
CALLED MEETING HELD

Funds Are Sought 
To Buy or Build 
Electric System

Present electric rates In Oold­
thwalte are entirely reasonable 
for a local generating plant, but 
If e l e c t r i c  current can be 
purchased from the Colorado 
River Authority and a PWA 
grant of 45 per cent of the nec­
essary funds can be obtained, an 
annual saving of practically SO 
per cent of the present rates 
is estimated. ‘This Is the gist of 
a 37-page report on a munlclpcd 
light and power system for Oold­
thwalte which was presented to 
the City Council at Its regular 
meeting last Monday evening.

The report, which cost the city 
$400, was prepared by Wm. O. 
Morrison, consulting engineer, of 
Waco who specializes In munici­
pal electric systems. A house to 
house canvass was made here to 
determine the number and type 
of electric lights and appliances 
In use.

Estimates based on the data 
secured show that there are now 
378 actual and 40 potential con­
sumers of electricity In Oold­
thwalte who are paying $24,471 
annually for 530.688 kilowatt 
hours. The report estimates 
that by building and operating 
a generating and transmission 
system here, a saving over pres­
ent rates of only $1,907 or 7.7 
per cent would be possible. ’This 
o f course Is not sufficient to 
warrant the city going Into the 
business.

The City Council took no ac­
tion after hearing the report ex­
cept to Instruct Mr. Morrison to 
apply for a 45 per cent PWA 
grant sufficiently large to build 
a generating plant or to buy the 
plant now In use here. This ap­
plication will be made without 
further expense to the city, and 
the grant can be returned with­
out using, if so desired Should 
the city enter the electric distri­
bution field, many believe that 
the present system of the Com­
munity Public Service should be 
purchased outright. Applica­
tion to the PWA does not bind 
the city to any course of action.

The PWA has already given 
the application a temporary de­
signation. and the pap>ers for the 
final application have been sent 
to the city for completion.

In Lampasas, a city election 
has been called to decide whet­
her the distribution system now 
operating there .should be pur­
chased or not, but in Oatesville. 
the council decided against mu­
nicipal ownership of the light 
and power system and cancelled 
its application for a PWA grant 
to buy or construct one. The 
question Is a complex one and 
cannot be decided off-hand.

------------ o------------

FIRE

The Fire Department was call­
ed to the home o f J. W. Edwards 
on Tuesday, where sparks from 
the flue had set the roof afire. 
It was soon extinguished with 
but little damage done.
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At a called meeting of the Art 
and Civic CTub last week. Miss 
Anne Coleman was elected to 
membership In the club and Mrs 
V. C. Bradford was elected to 
serve on the Library Board.
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The
Trent State 

Bank

No business too large 

for us to handle, none 

too small to receive

every courtesy and

attention.

Center Point
By OrelU Wewon

Plan Fun for 160,000 Children]
After a week’* absence I am 

back again I will Include some 
of last weeks happenings, also.

' Twenty-two of the 4-H Club 
i boys and girls, two sponsors and 
four visitors enjoyed a two-day 

' encampment at Lake Banes, Au- 
Sgust 24 and 25 Everyone re- 
j ported a very nice time and we 
.hope we may have the oppor­
tunity of attending another en- 

I campment before too long. The 
j girls are all thrilled to hear that 
I we now have a Home Demon- 
I strator and we hope to have our 
I club organised soon.
I Miss Bonnie Jarrett from | 
! South Bennett spent the week | 
¡end with OveU* Wesson. |
' Clyde Taylor Is at home from | 
1 the Army on a visit.

Will Burcks and family from |
the J. D

Goldthwaite, Texas

Pleasant Grove
By Ruby D. Berry

There were small crowds at 
Sunday school Sunday morning 
and League Sunday night 

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Lucas 
•pent Sunday In the Ray Berry 
home,

Mrs Sam Miller's sister, Mrs 
Albert Smith and three sons 
visited in the Sam Miller home j 
last week |

Mr and Mrs J. D. Hodges 
visited In the O. K. Berry home 
Thursday night.

Will Berry and family had re­
latives from Alabama visiting 
them last Thursday evening 

Mr, and Mrs. Will Moreland 
spent Sunday In the Melvin 
Crawford home.

Mr, and Mrs. Chester Frazier 
visited in the Charlie Berry 
home Sunday.

Seaborn Bennlngfleld and 
family and O. Z. Berry and 
family visited In the Earnest 
Bennlngfleld home Sunday.

Mrs. W. J. Jeffery visited In 
the Charlie Milier home Sunday

D. visited Mrs R. C. Miller and 
Syble. Tuesday evening.

Several of the children went 
to Ooldthwaite Thursday and 
Friday to register for the com­
ing school term.

Cecil Harbour spent Monday 
night In the Charlie Miller home.

Mary Helen and Dorothy Cor­
nelius returned to their home In 
Comanche Monday after several 
days visit with their aunt, Mrs 
Clark Miller.

Mr and Mrs. Will Berry and
Mr. and Mrs Walker Berry visit­
ed Mrs. Walker Berry’s brother. 
Pomp Watson and family, who 
live on the other side of San 
Angelo.

Marvin Hancock from Big 
Wells and R. L. Armstrong from 
Crystal City spent Tuesday 
night In the Ray Berry home.

Marvin Collier and family 
spent Sunday in the Bill Vlrden 
home.

Rosa Lee Jeffery spent Sunday 
in the John Covington home.

Bill Virden and family spent 
Monday night with grandmother 
Collier at Star.

Travis Griffin and family 
spent Sunday with Mrs. Queenleevening.

Ray Berry and family visited ' Covington.
Mr. and Mrs Brit Berry Satur- i Henry Yeager from Pecan 
day night. Wells, visited In the W. J. Jef-

Mrs Sam Miller visited Tom fery home Saturday.
Miller and family at town a few W J, Jeffery visited In the Pe- 
days last week ¡can Wells community Friday

Mr and Mrs. Charlie Miller 
and Syble spent last Wednesday 
night in the Tom Miller home.

Mrs Will Berry and Mrs 
Weldon Lucas spent Wednesday 
in the Ray Berry home. ,

H.irvy Jeffery and family 1 
visited in the W. J. Jeffery home j 
Thursday night. i

Mrs. Ray Berry and Novaleen 
and Mrs O Z. Berry and Ruby

DRESSED
B I L L

FRYERS AT— 
’ S C A F E

DRY CLEANING
Pressing and Kepairiiig 

of all garments for 
Men. Women and Children. 
We have the experience 
cad rntx-hinery to do the 
work right.

C. M. BURCH

WHEN WOMEN
NEED CARDUI

U  you seem to have lost 
aomo o f your strength you h.nd 
for your favorite activities, cr 
for your housework . . . and 
esn-e less about your meals . . .  
and suffer severe discom fort 
at cerU ln  times, try Cardul!

Thousands and thousands o f 
women say It has helped them.

r.y increasing the appetite, 
im proving digestion, Cardul 
helps you to get more nourish­
ment. As strength returns, 
ur.nccessary functional aches, 
pr.ins and nervousness Just 
seem to go away.

H O M E

/s where you place

Your FUTURE
Everyone has plans for a home of 

their own. Why not make this a realiza­
tion? Call and let us help plan that new 
home with you.

J. H. RANDOLPH LUMBER CO.
. Goldthwaite, Texas

¡CaUfomla visited in 
I Fallon home Friday

'They were entertained with a 
; party in that home Friday even- 
! Ing. The young folks are the ■ 
ones who usually enjoy them- 

i selves St the parties, but tht«
: was not altogether the case a 
this party. Ju-st ask .«»me of th e , 
older people who were there. ,

Mrs Vernon Tyson, Jr., return­
ed home after a visit with her 
sister In Dallas.

Several from this community 
attended the Baptist Association 
St Rock Springs. Friday.

J. C. and Ovella Wesson are 
saying with their grandmother 
Wesson in town and attending 
school there.

Elmo Fallon dined with Miss 
Sue Bare Sunday.

Ruthie, Billie Mae, and John 
Dean Stark spent Friday In the 
C C Wesson home.

The party In the Taylor home 
Saturday night wsis enjoyed by 
a large crowd.

Mr and Mrs W H O. Cham­
bers o f MuUln called in the C. O. 
Stark home Thursday.

School has started again after 
a short vacation. Several from 
this community are attending 
school at Ooldthwaite. TTie 
school out here will start Sept 
12

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Taylor 
visited in the home of his 
mother awhile Friday night.

Bammon Perry spent the week 
end with home folks.

Several from here attended 
the singing at MulUn Sunday and 
some attended the Regatta at 
Brown wood

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Hammond 
and children visited In the home 
of Mrs Kate Shelton Sunday.

Mrs. J S. Wesson spent Sun­
day with her son, Craig and 
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Kid Bare and 
daughter spent Sunday In the 
Sam Carroll home.

Norman Williams and Arthur 
Williams called on J M. Miys 
Sunday.

Mrs Gene Shelton and baby 
and M1.SS Ovella Wesson called In j 
the T’aylor home Saturday.

Mrs Kate Shelton spent Wed 
nesday night in the C. C. Wes­
son home.

The Industrious Idlers met 
a1th Mr.s. Julia Taylor and 
daughter August 25 The club 
was reorganized with the follow­
ing officers elected; Mrs. Curtis 
Taylor, president; Mrs. Vernon 
Tyson, Sr., vice-president and 
Miss Bessie Hutchings, secretary.' 
The club will meet with Mrs. E. 
F. Cunningham September 9.

Mr. and Mrs. Ollle Shelton. Mr 
and Mr.s. Amos Shelton and 
Johnnie, Deward and Elmo Fal­
lon Visited In the Oarl Perry- 
home Thursday night.

Miss Ovella Wesson accom­
panied Miss Arlle Taylor and 
mother to Mullln Saturday. 

------------ -------------

Benn!r;{5|
»«f* unltij tB, 

Of the »
snd Mrs

The th. ufind» of school children attending the gUmorout Castle of 
Poods St the tloMen Jubilee celebration of the State Fair of Texas in 
Dallas dur.nit the m..nth of October will have a grand good •» 
as unusual ducational facilities. L A Woods. Sute Superintendent of 
Public Instruction, believes that the exhibiU. programs, and sp^ia 
enlertainment given for children and grown-ups in the CasUe of EooJi- will be suAcient causewill be of such striking educational value that ihev will be suAcient cause 
for sending ICO.tXKl Texas school children to the Fair In the 
Mr Woods (right) is conferring in his office at Austin with Granv-ille W 
Moore (center), chairman of toe Fo<id Imlustries Committee, who will
resenl'the Castle, snd Rex V Ler.li (lift), managing diwtor. both 

liect
like for children who visit the C-stle
R.'P;

rrsvni irr  V •»Lie, »uu i*v w » w-s.!..» , as .
alias, on the subject of clow ns. p«rfcnn;ns»»"irnals. soui»rin. and the

Jones Valley
By Mrs. Geo. D. Brooks

West Lake Merritt
Bv Miss Inei Ritchie

School started thU morning 
The children all seemed glad to 
go back to their school work.

Mrs. Cell-T Hanson of San An­
gelo spent the week end with her 
parents. Mr and Mrs. W B Wil­
cox. Due to a change In her 
plans, her boys will not return 
home with her but will remain 
with their grandparents.

Mrs. Norma Braabury and 
family of San Angelo spent the 
week end with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Tip Roberts.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Wilcox 
and boys visited Mr. and Mrs. 
W. B Wilcox Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs Tom Hale of Big 
Valley vtalt«'d Mr and Mrs. Earl 
Hale Sunday. They spent the 
day on the river

Sunday was Bro Tolliver’s day 
to preach In our commnuUy.. We 
had both day and night services, 
but there wasnt a good atten­
dance. He will be back the first 
Sunday In October Bro Per- 
tlllo will be here the third Sun­
day in September. We hope and 
pray everyone will try to come 
on these days and worship with 
us.

Mrs. Josle Crawford of Long

Love Yoa Trslj' 
The table kt 

*»s laid with 11 
centered wtthij 

I pink rote*

Mr and Mrs Tom Cave and 
M1S.S Ruby, spent Wednesday In 
Graham, visiting their son, Clar­
ence and family.

Mrs Tom Corbett. Mrs. Ora 
McNamara and daughter Ann, of 
Graham and Mrs Llllle Goodwin 
and Mrs. E B Davis o f Breck- 
enridge spent a part of last 
week In the C. O Norton home.

Miss Louise Booker retumwd 
home Wednesday from Arp. after 
several weeks visit with her sis­
ter. Brownie Leverett and wife 
and R V Leverett and family 
accompanied her for a visit In 
the Booker home.

Mrs Ira Hutchings and moth­
er, Mrs. Harrison visited Mrs 
Chas Rudd Thursday afternoon

Tom Fuller made a business 
trip to Fort Worth Thursday.

Mrs. Joe Ritchie and Inez 
visited In the Baker home Thurs­
day afternoon.

Mr.s R D Price and children 
spent a part of last week In the 
Grover Price home.

Rev. Smith and family of 
Buffalo, have bought the W D 
Clements place. We welcome 
them Into our community.
Earl E’.lls and family of Coman-

T H l STATE OF TEXAS
To the Sheriff or any Consta­

ble of Mills County, Greeting;

You are hereby commanded to 
summon MAE DAVIS by making 
publication o f this Citation once 
in each week for four successive 
weeks previous to the return day 
hereof,-In some newspaper 

, llshed In your county, to appear ^ " “ *̂ '** ĥi. 
'a t  the next regular term of thej^*” " '“'’  ̂ Th»' 
District Court of Mills County, to • 
be holden at the Court House I ^*'*‘*''** ot 
thereof. In Ooldthwaite, Texas, P'
on the 4th Monday In September 
A. D. 1938, the same being the ^
26th day of September A D. 1938, i **''“'*'*4 
then and there to answer a petl- *^"'1*!!***^^ 
tlon filed In said Court on the „
18th day of August A. D. 1938, i*'"*
a suit, numbered on the docket of J;* 
said Court No 2571 wherein 8 B 
DAVIS U Plaintiff, and MAE a.Z T , 
DAVIS Is Defendant, and said 
petition alleging:

AS ine cerm-
Plaintiff alleges that he was le- > Miss Lornl» 

gaily married to the Defendant 
in Mills County, Texas on or 
about the 4th day of February A 
D. 1904 and continued to live 
with her as his wife until on or 
about the 10 th day of January j corated with 
A. D. 1938 and the reason of said' roses Servtî  
separation that the defendant, punch bowl n 
and sometime prior thereto the Fallon of Cc;, 
Defendant began a tyranlcal bride 
cruel treatment and would call| 
the Plaintiff vile names and mrs. m ut  
abuae this Plaintiff and that he on Au| 8. 
could not have any peace at passed swir 1 
home at all, and she would get several days 
In a Jealoua rage aUte of mind I death she vu 
and would order the Plaintiff | irlth her 
from their home and wotfld not 
let him In said home, and the 
Plaintiff treated her with kind­
ness as husband would do and 
was forced to leave the Defen­
dant and did abandon her and 
has since lived apart from her 
of said cruel treatment was such 
nature as render the Plaintiff 
from living with her again and 
Insupportable.

Wherefore the PlalntUf prays 
the court that the defehdant 
cited to appear and answer this I ’
petition and upon final hearingi 
hereof the PlalnUff prays for "
Judgment that said marriage *>* ^ ^ * ^  „  i L  
dissolved betwreen the Plaintiff 
and Defendant and be declared 
null and void.

HEREIN FAIL NOT, but have 
before said Court, at its aforesaid 
next regular term, this writ with 
your return thereon, showing 
how you hare executed the same

GIVEN UNDER MY HAND and 
the Beal of said Court, at office 
In Ooldthwaite, Texas, this the 
18th day o f August A. D. 1938.

B. J. KEESE. aerk  
District Court, Mills County
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name wu Muyj 
Aug 12. lie ( 
few miles r.onk| 
She wu uniMa 
C Whitt. 
children vm I 
cessed had in 
ea In Texu T

and a brotba,fj 
line.

I.'land. California and Mr.«; C. J. 1 
Crawford called In the A. p  I o*'«. spent Saturday night In the 
Kirk home Friday evening. f*'® Hutchings home.

Mrs. A D. Kirk and baby visit- ! Dellls and family, se­
ed Mrs Geo. Brooks Sunday g f - ! Charles Thompson 

4em oon, and family, for a visit In the
Berlee Roberson Is spending Raymond Burdette home Sun- 

the week with his aunt, Mrs. A ‘‘ ay evening.
D. Kirk. Ira Hutchings and faml'y ac-

Mr and Mrs. C. C Baxter of eompanied her mother, Mrs 
Dublin spent Sunday at their ! and grandson, Melvin,
camp cotuge on the river. , far as Stephenvllle, on their

Several new cases of anthrax ' home to Fort Worth. Af-
have been reported In our com- 
munity. Most everyone has vac-

STOP, LOOK AND LISTEN 
If U Forgot to order anything 
from your grocer or drug storr 
BILL’S might have it.
Give us a ring—BILL’S CAFE 

-O
Eagle Classifieds Result.«:

UquM. TsbMi| 
Salve, Nat 

Droft 
Try

Woriril

BE sum

S llL

STAND))

Rudd Station, Texaco Gas and 
on  Firestone Tire* and Tube*. 
In the same old place.

clnated and we hope It will soon 
be under control. It Is reported 
that Luther Jernlgan and W B 
Wilcox are the heavy- lasers in 
this community.

Mr and Mrs O. B Bell and 
family attended the .«tnglng at 
Mullln Sunday afternoon.

Sydney Breoks spent Fridi« 
with Berlee Roberson and Mrs 
A D Kirk.

Elva Faye Brook.s spent Friday 
with Vera Mae Bell.

Mr. and Mrs. Dalton Powell 
left this week to go to Wingate 
hunting work. The children re­
mained with Mr. and Mr.s. Sam 
Richardson of Ridge.

ter a week’s visit here. They 
were met there by Mr. and Mr.s.

YOUR 
MONEY 
BACK 
IF WATS
DON 7 
O'E,

J. W. -nms.
Mr. ar.d Mrs A. J. Miller and 

daughter, were guests in the 
Ritchie home Sunday afternoon.

Mr.-i. Geo. Hill and son. Mr. and 
Mr.- Anderson and baby and 
Miss E.sle Hill o f Austin were 
guesU In the Ira Hutchings 
home Sunday evening. 1
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Trade with Ooldthwaite store

^  Y£AM i I

DDlc-i^i w Î5TRADE AT HO.ME

Up in the Morning
Feeling Fine!

READ THE ADVEK'nSEAIENTS POWDER*v.»vou* eaua S T o n c . . .

^O M O M IC A l 
^  COMfSi

The refreshing relief so 
many folks say they get by 
taking Black-Draught for con­
stipation makes them enthu­
siastic about this famous, 
purely vegetable laxative.

Black-Draught pula the digesUvs 
tract In better eoDdltlon to act regu­
larly, «very day, without your con- 
ttnually having to take masifiiyf to 
Biovs ths bowels.

Next Ume, be sure to try

B L A Æ K - ’ “ c  -  
D R A U G H T

A GOOD LAXATTVa

* J

•Properly Equipped 
Shop.

P>alanced Parts 
Stock.

Factory Trair.tu! 
Meccani OP.

Desini. £T to ;rivo 
Better Soi’\*ice

J A ­ N E A R  T H E  PARK

231 E A S T
STREET

I BLOCKS
BCATDICB Nf-LBM

MARTIN :
[)OWNT0WF R O M

TOU «rr
Your car was built to give you sati.factorv service

rightfully entitled to.
Nothing left o ff that la needed 

Nothing put on that U unnecessary.
No Job too s m a n i o  Job too large for us to handle efficiently
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!l «1 1
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CfcSNAPSHOT CUIL
, "OFF-GUARD" PICTURES '

lUONEY IN THE BANK
r  T 0 KI( ff ARDSON, Sweretmry
‘ Breeder-Feeder Aw»ocl*U«i

Ifilo U like money 
Iff u loo* “
find
>af*er yo“

thousands of
, wUl tell you af- 
mericci*- There 
[ w be about 11.- 

rr in the bank" 
and probably 

j in the four ad- 
Ifoi which figures 
li It the moment.
I jjje from 8.000 
L,n to those just 
P feed one or two 
5 the tiny ditch 
I for Its purpose 

Lnyons holding 
>di of beef steers.
Lt probably has 
^  of feed, both 
thije. in hUtory. 
f»:;} direrted land 
I wheat Into other 
h more feed than 
I t  on their farms 
lieason If stored 
las dry silage Its 

feeding value 
..¡itea but If

1 in E trench silo
liten years from
L d be that long
r  drouth or hard
b  a month after

[ale can be con-
or no cash

d.rt-moTlni tool
h a drag-line will
r  esn be dug in a
d the level. any.

length, depth or width to suit 
the conditions and the needs of 
the owner. I f rock Is too close to 
the surface or ground water too 
high for the desired depth, the 
dirt excavated can be piled up 
to raise the walls above the 
ground level, and Increase the 
depth of the trench sufficiently 
to Insure good packing o f the 
ensilage, which is essential to 
proper curing and keeping of the 
material.

Any crop can be ensiled, even 
after the grain Is mature and the 
stalks partially dried out. The 
Ideal condition of course Is while 
stalks and foliage are still green 
and sufficient, but If drouth or 
frost gets In Its work before the 
crop can be ensiled, adding 
water will supply the deficiency 
of moisture and make ensilage 
of dry, or partially dry, material 

Com, sweet sorgo and grain 
sorghums carry sufficient sugars 
and easily convertible starches to 
which turns the material into en­
silage. Sudan grass and the leg­
umes require the addition of 
some fermenting material, and 
black strap molasses, a few gal­
lons to the ton of ensilage, will 
do the Job. Crops may be suc­
cessfully ensiled In whole stalks 
or an ensilage cutter may be 
used. In either case success or 
failure depends on thorough 
packing In order to exclude air 
pockets. It Is easier to properly 
pack cut ensilage than stalks, 
and it Is easier to feed out. but 
the lack of a cutter has not pre-

For morw natural pleturaa. catch subjects *'eff-guard”— unaware of the
camera.

iliool Supplies
dit? school Mippliea at equal prices, we offer the 
I Um  in Loose Leaf Note Book Covers, etc.

ntaln Pena from 25c up to Sl.M and the Sheaf- 
t2.65 up. Mechanical Pencils from Itc up. 

I yentih from le te Se.

|l« win appreciate a share of your trade 
THTY L.tST—Free Balloons with every pur-

: SI more.

l e m e n t s
|UG and JEWELRY STORE

•THE KEXALL STORE”

Goldthwaite, Texas

k rOST people Ilka to have their
 ̂pictures taken. In tact, they like 

It so well that whan they see the 
camera they put on a special ” pic- 
tore expraaaton.” And aa a rule this 
tpecial “plctara face" Isn't what we 
want at all.

There's a way to keep your aub- 
Jacta from seaming camera-con­
scious. Briefly, It la—"Catch them 
when they aren't looking." Don't let 
them know their picture la being 
taken.

Pictures so taken are known na 
"off-guard” anapahots. Buch snaps 
attract attention bocanss they pic­
ture the subject In a natural, char­
acteristic pose and get away from 
the ufual look-at-the-camera-and- 
smile type of picture with which we 
are all too familiar. An "off-guard” 
picture can tell t real story while 
the other t}pe tevds to be just a 
record picture.

How to take them? It's easy. Just 
learn to handle your camera un­
obtrusively. Walt until your subject 
la paying no attention to you. Then 
casually snap hla picture. It's ail a 
matter ot using your camera non­

chalantly and rfflclently. The belter 
yon ran do that, the more easily yon 
can capture cnapehots that are truly 
“off-guard."

If you use a focusing camera, with 
fast lens, try to anticipate picture 
opportunities, and set the camera In 
advance tor distance and proper ex- 
poanre. Then whan the snapshot 
chanca develops, all you need do Is 
shoot

For example, to take the picture 
above, the camera was aet In ad­
vance for elx feet. Lens and abutter 
were set tor an expoiurs of 1/SO sec­
ond at t.ll—leas than normal, be 
cause the bright, tunny beach was 
reflecting plenty of light On a 
grassy lawn, which reflects little 
light, exposure would bare been l /!>0 
at f.8. With hia camera preset, all 
the picture taker bad to do was wait 
for the melon to be cut. and catch 
his companion's delighted expres­
sion. It was just a matter of lifting 
tbe camera and snapping tbe sbuP 
ter.

If you haven't tried taking "off­
guard” shots, try it. It's fun, and the 
reeulta are a delight

John van Guilder

Harvest 
Dollars

tE WORTH MORE 
[HAN 1 0 0  CENTS
ifing You a $4:20 Reading Value
g o l d t h w a i t e  e a g l e

Prinfor Om, Vesr-li.ye)

A N D

vented hundreds of farmers frem 
making and using whole-stalk 
ensilage. Those who have not 
had previous experience in stor­
ing ensilage should consult their 
neighbor who has, or the county 
agent, who will supply detailed 
information In person or by bul­
letin.

Ensilage is more digestible 
than dry forage, hence an acre 
of feed in the silo Is worth more 
as feed than the same acre cur­
ed dry. There Is also less waste, 
and the acre of feed will go far­
ther In the silo. It furnishes 
succulent feed when green pas­
tures are not available, and Is 
therefore relished by all live­
stock. It keeps the digestive ap­
paratus of cattle and sheep func­
tioning better, they get more 
nourishment from dry grain feed 
and therefore produce more 
milk or weight for each pound 
of expensive grain they eat.

No farm, even If It has only a 
family milk cow and the work 
stock, can afford to do without 
a trench silo. One year's use 
will pay for it, and if not needed 
this winter, think what it would 
mean to have "money in the 
bank” when the next drouth 
hits!

Bulls Creek
By Je-xsie Mae Sheppard

State Building 
Plan Opposed

AUSTIN.—Governor Allred dis­
closed Wednesday many busi­
ness men oppose the proposal to 
construct a state office and 
courts building.

The chief executive recently 
applied for a $2,600.000 PWA loan 
and grant, promising te call a 
special session of the Legisla­
ture for raising the State’s share 
of the cost If the application was 
approved.

He said he had become ‘‘dis­
couraged” at the prospect of 
PWA approval of the project, 
adding many business men had 
written and telegraphed their 
opposition on the basis the State 
should eliminate .some of Its 
boards, bureaus and commis­
sions rather than construct an 
additional building to house 
those now occupying rented 
quarters. At least one member 
of the Legislature has expressed 
disapproval, the Governor added. 

------------ o------------

Bill’s Cafe, the little place with 
big eats.

POPULAR
mechanics

^ > ^ O A Z I N E

S,000 
Artidts 
0 Y*or

'  itttn U r P ria f» r Om* Y ta r~  #3, jo>

Ily $ 2  *.2 ^  a Year
THE MONEY-SAVINO COUPON

 ̂ Tour newipeyef aad PoptUmr MarJUnlca Magano ■

The Baptist revival at Big Val­
ley conducted by Bro. Thcmp.son 
from Mineral Wells, came to a 
close Thursday night, August 25. 
There were four additions to the 
church, one by letter and three 
by baptism.

Mrs. Forrest Ros.s’ mother, 
Mrs. Morgan from near Coman­
che has been visiting in the Ross 
home the past week.

Joe Sellers and family from 
Big Springs are on an extended 
visit in the A T. Sellers home 
at Big Valley.

Mr. and Mr.s. J. R. Mitchell had 
as guests FYlday, her father and 
mother, Mr. and Mrs. Adams 
and her sister and husband, Bro. 
and Mrs. Johnson, all o f Ranger. 
Alberta Windham returned with 
them for an extended visit.

Mrs. Ada Nowell spent Sunday 
In the Fred Nowell home.

G L. Mauldin has been spend­
ing the latter part of the sum­
mer In the L. M. Sellers home.

Jessie Sheppard Is quite sick 
this week.

The Casey Smith family gave 
Thelma Reagan a farewell party

Monday night. August '29. She 
will attend Draughon's Business 
College at Abilene.

Fred Nowell has been 111 but 
l.s better now.

Jessie Sheppard spent last 
week In the Mitchell home In 
Big Valley. ______

THE AWFUL PRICE YOU 
PAY FOR BEING

NERVOUS

Scallorn \
By Mrs. Cora Ford

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hines and 
Miss Oreda spent one day last 
week In Santa Anna with their j 
daughter and sister, Freda Todd.)

Hassel Ford and family from 
Mercury spent several days last! 
week with home folks. |

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Laugh- 
lln and Johnnie D. Ford took 
Rachel to EUdorado Saturday to 
be ready to enter school Mon­
day morning.

Mrs. Cora Ford and Fleming 
and Mrs. Ann Kirkpatrick spent 
Friday night and Saturday with 
their sister, Mrs. Elffle Luckle 
and family In Granbury.

John Samuel Kuykendall 
drove out a new Chevrolet car 
Saturday to use In hla work.

Miss Cecil Joe finished her 
summer school work last week 
and Is at home waiting for her 
school to open. We wish them 
both success in their new duties

Tom Hufstutler and wife spent 
Sunday in Terrlal Casb^r's 
home.

Mrs Marvin Laughlln, Mrs 
Cora FY>rd and Mrs. Kirkpatrick 
s'pent Tuesday In Mrs. Webb 
Laughlln’a home and helped her 
quilt.

The party at Mr. Obenhaus’s 
Saturday night was enjoyed by 
aU.

Mrs. T. J. Laughlln left Wed­
nesday to visit with her son 
EUza.

Mrs. Ann Kirkpatrick went 
to Bowser Sunday, to visit her 
sister-in-law, Mrs. Will Martin 
and family, before returning to 
her home In Junction.

Albert Herford and wife and 
Mrs. LUa Crawford spent Sun 
day In Mrs. R. D. Efvans home.

Fred Wlttenburg and family 
were In Lometa Saturday even­
ing shopping and meeting their 
friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie MUchem 
of West Texas visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Hale Sunday.

Mrs. Walter Henry Is suffering 
with a bad foot caused from 
spider bite.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hines and 
Mrs. Tom Hale attended the as­
sociation Friday at Rock Springs.

Mr. and Mrs. Rayford Davis 
and son from Temple, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Blake from Ze­
phyr were week end guests of 
Mrs. Ora Black.

Mrs. Fred Wlttenburg’s sister 
and husband of San Antonio Is 
visiting with her.

Next Saturday night and Sun­
day is Bro. Pertlllo's regular 
church day, so let’s everyone be 
present. There will be dinner 
on the grounds.

------------ o------------
Rudd Station, Texaco Gas and 

Oil Firestone Tires and Tubes. 
In the same old place.

------------ o------------
Patronixe Eagle Advertisers

Meteorite Rips Huge 
Hole When It HiU 
Land Near Menard

MENARD -Somewhere below 
the jumbled bottom of a big 
hole on the Willie Wllkerson 
ranch 12 miles west of Menard 
tonight lay a secret from the 
heavens.

A meteorite blazed a bright 
trail across the sky at 9 o ’clock 
last Wednesday night, then 
plummeted to the earth and 
burled itself—maybe 30 feet and 
maybe 3,000 feet deep—In the 
landscape of Silver Mine Creek

Keeping to himself until late 
Saturday the site o f th emeteor- 
Ite invasion, Monroe White, 
foreman on the ranch, today 
shared with the yawning hole 
created by the heavenly visitor 
the curious attention of hun­
dreds. Sunday at least 1,000 
persons visited the hole.

"Why did I keep It a secret?” 
asks White, a cousin to Jim 
White, discoverer o f the Carls­
bad Caverns. "Well, I was bu.sy 
and I had to build a fence around 
to keep stock and people from 
falling In and breaking their 
necks. And when I did go to 
town, it was a long time before 
I could find anyone who’d be­
lieve what I told them

"The first thing I saw was a 
spreading glow In the sky,” White 
calmly recalls. “ A moment la­
ter the headquarters ranch house 
about me was lit up as If by a 
bunch of brilliant electric lights 
—and that meteor was coming 
right at me. At first It sounded 
like a distant siren. Then It 
shrieked.

“ I just sat and let her come. It 
was pretty. The bottom or head 
was blue, the straight spreading 
tall was red. all red, no yellow 
Then the light went plum’ out. 
I don’t know whether It was 500 
feet or 200 miles up there but It 
was a full minute and a half 
after the light went out before 
the meteor hit the ground about 
three miles from the ranch 
house.

"Then It struck earth. There 
was a flash—it looked as if the 
meteor had exploded and fired 
bark Into the skies like a roman 
candle. I guess that was some 
of the rocks exploding. Then I 
heard It. It was like a heavy 
clap of thunder, like lightening 
had struck right by you.

“ I got up at 3 o ’clock the next 
morning and rode down to where 
I thought It should have landed 
I stopped my horse about 30! 
yards away. Then I  came on up 
When I got here the hole smelled 
like a dynamite explosion had 
just occurred. But the earth 
was cut off clean and later in 
the day I found singed grass, 
pulled in with the topsoil, down 
there 23 feet In the hole.

FILMS
lEmifEi

Here'» your upportuluty to gtouin 
tmeri ei>peuui( enepehoee m  
kelow moM direct by meil al- 
lere. E L K O  enapehote heve 
blweye been coneidered es the 
beet ai the Iwld Being bordee 
pnnied and iadapruoiad. Elko f l ^ e
pteturet have become America’e

Ji*** Yw" inapahot» ^  I  I L

f i t  l i u
M mat AM•Milt MN

Hudson Bros.
What yon want when yen want W

“ I guess those university pro­
fessors—some of them were
here yesterday—will want to find 
that thing. They were sure In­
terested. They clipped off tbe 
top of a mesqulte tree that was 
kinda singed and took a bnneh 
of black rocks out of the bottom 
of the hole.
—GRADY HILL In San Angelo 
Standard-Times.

LOANS ON WOOL 
Wool growers may obtain loans 

on wool from banks or loan con­
cerns, In cooperation with ths 
government's Commodity Credtl 
Corp., by complying with certain 
detailed requirements Informa­
tion about which can be obtain­
ed from the Commodity Credit 
Corp.

Patronise Eagle Advertlsen

W e are cooperating 
with the F e d e r a l  
Housing Act. See u* 
for details.

BARNES &
McCu l l o u g h

"Everything to Build Anything"
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COMPLETE wringer protection at a 
new low price in this new 1938 EASY 
with SUPER-SAFETY wringer.
GUARDIAN BAR Safety Release ex­
tends all the way across BOTH sides 
of wringer— not at top 01 side, but con­
veniently located in FRONT of rolls.
SAFETY ZONE construction prevents 
entrance of hands. ROLL STOP mech­
anism stops revolution of BOTH rolls, 
prevents accidental restarting.

ASK FOR FREE HOME D E M O N ST R A T IO N

j |^ A G t i» n  andAGtizen and 
a Taxpaytr

P U B U C
S E R V K i

COM PANY,

Alert and Ea^ 
lb Served
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Letters of Interest From Mills County Communities
Rock Springs Lake Merritt

By Mr«. Eol» NIckob By Mr*. DourU^ Robertson
Live Oak

By Mrs. i .  a  Brwwii

There was Sunday school. Sun­
day morning

I hope our Eklitor had a nice 
time while on her vacation.

The association went over in 
a big way Thursday night. There 
were seven preachers present 
and Friday there were eighteen 
or twenty. The program was 
fine Irom start to finish. It will 
meet with the Center City 
church next year in September.

The school bus was on time 
Monday morning. Good beginn­
ing. We hope for them a good 
ending next spring.

Several from here attended the 
singing at Mullin Sunday. Those 
who didn’t go missed a treat. 
They meet at Mt. Olive first of 
December for their next con­
vention. Will Huggins was elect­
ed president for this next year.

Homer Doggett and family 
went back to Coleman Sunday. 
His wife and daughter have 
spent a month with her mother. 
Mrs Nlckols.

John Roberts and wife spent 
Sunday afternoon in J F Davb’ 
home.

Sidney Pa.ss and family from 
Abilene visited his parents over 
the week end

W A Daniel and family visit­
ed In the J. F Davis home Sun­
day evennlg

Joe Bailey and wife from Mel­
vin visited J T. Stark and fami­
ly Saturday night.

Philip Nlckols and mother 
visited in the Cooke home Sun­
day evening

B F Renfro .spent Saturday 
night with his son. Adrain. He 
was on his way to Ridge to 
preach Sunday.

Some are still losing their 
stock from anthrax Most all 
have vaccinated.

James Roberts visited Clifford 
Boyd Sunday.

B A Meeks and wife from Fort 
Worth spent the week end with 
Mr and Mr McC’.ary

Mrs &m a Whitt left for Waco 
Saturday afternoon with her 
grandson, who lives in Waco.

Mrs Eula Nlckols visited with 
Mrs Lula Gatlin and Miss Love 
Saturday night.

Homer Doggett and family. 
Rudolph Co ke and family. 
James Roberts and Mr< Elula 
Nlckols and Phillip vUited with 
James Nickols and wife Satur-

Mr and Mrs Patterson are 
back at home ready to begin the 
school work after spending the 
summer In school at Austin. Our 
school begins Monday morning.

Bro Brucks preached at the 
school house Sunday afternoon. 
He has an appointment each 
first Sunday afternoon at 3:00 
o'clock. Let’s not forget this 
and all try to get to hear his 
good messages.

Mrs J. L. Roberts.-in spent Sat­
urday night and Sunday with 
Douglas Robertson and family.

Miss Kathrene Rvan \islted 
Miss Isabell Orelle Friday.

Grady Kennedy and family 
have gone to Amarillo.

Mr and Mrs. Jim Weatherby. 
J. T Robertson. Mr« Harvey 
Dunkle and Miss Johnnie Belle 
Circle called In the Douglas Ro­
bertson home Sunday afternoon.

Miss Helols Pamplen iras a 
guest of Ml.sses Russie Pay and 
Margaret Oden Sunday.

Mr and Mrs John Patterson 
spent the week end with rela­
tives at Abilene

Earl Oden and wife from Co­
manche visited in the Bud Oden 
home Sunday

Miss Beatrice Long spent Sun­
day night with Mr and Mrs L- 
B Bramblett and children

Mrs R F Daniel and boys had 
business in Comanche Saturday.

Mr« Robert Ryan. Katherine 
Ryan and little Miss AnlU 
Johnson spent one afternoon in 
the Robert.son home.

Mrs J. W Dellb went through 
the clinic at Santa Anna last 
week She Is confined to her 
bed quite a lot now. but we hope 
her condition will be Improved 
.seen.

Edgar McNutt Is spending a 
few days In Coleman.

Several from here attended 
Ti-ades Day. Monday.

Johnnie Belle Long spent Sat­
urday night with Mr. and Mrs 
Lynn Nix.

------------ o------------

Mr and Mrs Wylie and child­
ren have returned from a vblt 
to Rotan. Her mother accom­
panied them home for a visit.

Rudd Station. Texaeo Gas and 
Oil Firestone Tires and Tubes.

day night.
Janece Doggett spent Saturday 

with Mr.« Dwight Nickols In 
town.

Mrs. Homer D o g g e t t  and 
daughter spent Wednesday 
and Thursday In town In Glenn 
Nlckols home.

Mrs Eula Nickols. Philip and 
Homer D'Pgelt and family visit­
ed Friday night in Center Point 
with Otis and Be.s.se Hutchings.

Adrian Renfro and wife are 
enjoying a new car.

Mrs. Harvey Dunl^e and Mi.ss 
Johnnie Belie Circ’.e went to 
town to the Christian Church 
Sunday morning.

Oliver Traylor and cousin. Roth 
Robertson, frem Big Valley went 
to Browmwood Sunday to the 
boat races with Shirley Nickols 
and wife.

Mrs Eula Nickols attended the 
S. E. Q. Club Tuesday afternoon 
in Mrs. Dan Callaway's home in 
town.

Mrs. B. F Renfro and B. F. 
Jr., Annette and Mary Beth spent 
aae/uUay night with Adrian Ren- 
tro juid family. B F and An­
nette will stay with Adrian and 
go to achool In Onidthwaite.

J. F. Davis and wife went to 
Brownwood last Wedne'day on 
boslness

Dan Turner and family from 
BIchland Springs and Beryl Tur­
ner and family from San Saba 
eounty «pent Sunday with Mrs. 
Maggie Traylor.

/bh n  Sloan and wife and two 
dnoghter.« from Holland. Texas. 
Tlelted In the Circle and Bohan- 
o o  homes one day last week Mrs 
Duey Bohanon Joined them and 
they all spent the night with 
Arnold Sloan and family in the 
Big VaUey.

In the same old place.

Mr and Mrs Roy Simpson 
had as guests In their home 
Sunday. Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Al­
len, Mr. and M>-.s. John Duncan 
and Mr and Mrs. Alnesworth 
Murphy.

Mrs C. G Peatherston la 
staying In town this week, car­
ing for her new granddaughter, 
little Betty Carol, who arrived 
Sunday morning.

Mrs Bill Daniel la on the sick 
list this week.

MIS.S Moline Brown of Fort 
Worth .sjDent the week end with 
home folks.

Mr. and Mrs Nolan Horton of 
Ponca City, Okla., spent the 
week end with her parents.

Mr and Mrs Joe Hodge Fox 
of Lampasas visited his father. 
Will Fox and family last Sunday

Those who attended the boat 
races at Lake Brownwood Sun­
day afternoon from this com ­
munity were Mr and Mrs Ed 
Randies. Glenn. Ruth. Mae and 
Fay Featherston; Von Dean 
OeesUn and Mortne and Mordlne 
Brown.

Dr and Mrs S. E Islnghour. 
of San Antonio visited In the Ed 
Randles home Sunday.

Miss Cleo Black left Monday 
for the opening of her school at 
Moline.

Miss Ruth Featherston leaves 
Friday for PflugervUle. where 
she will resume her work as 
English teacher for another year

Mr. and Mrs. E M. Page spent 
Sunday afternoon with Mr. and 
Mrs Will Pox.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Moreland 
and children of Brownwood 
visited in the C. G. Peatherston 
home Sunday.

We are glad to report Mrs 
R G Blackburn improving We 
hope she soon recovers.

C. G. Featherston and daugh­
ters. Mae and Fay, Mrs Matt 
Casbeer and Grandpa Feather­
ston spent part of this week 
visiting Mr. and Mrs Leon Long- 
ley in San Saba county.

------------ o------------

Ebony
Clementine Wilmeth Briley

Mr. and Mr.« Wood Roberts, 
Miss Odene Russell, Mrs. P. R. 
Reid, Mr. and Mrs. Edward Ea­
ger, Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Smith, 
and Miss Edith Thompson and 
her friend, Mu«5 Mary Lou Gil­
breath of Dublin, attended the 
singing convention at Mullin 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mr- Austin Cawyer 
and Edna Beth left Wednesday 
for San Angelo where Mr. Caw­
yer has been elected to teach 
math In the San Angelo Junior 
High School. Mr Cawyer began 
work there Thursday.

Mrs. Charles Griffin and chlld- 
I ren left Thursd ly for Brownwood 
' where Mrs. Griffin has rented a 
house, and will put Gladys and 

¡Charles Henrv In school.

Mr and Miv>. Ira Egger, who 
I have been living at San Angelo. 
I have returned to this community 
and are living in the P R. Reid 
house where Mr. and Mrs. Billie 
McNurlin used to live.

Trade with Goldthwalte stores i RE.AT) TIIK ADVERTISEMENTS

Mr. and Mr- Charm Whltten- 
burg. Baby Clint, and Mrs. Hat­
tie Whittenburg spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mr« Jack 'WllUams 
at Oakland.

John Franklin Crowder, who 
underwent an emergency opera­
tion for ruptur' d appendix in an 
El Paso hospital August 27, Is 
reported to be doing fine. He 
was expected to be able to be 
moved to the home of his aunt 
In E3 Paso Monday.

Mr and Mr- Roy Reynolds 
and children spent Sunday with 
Mrs. Reynold's mother, Mrs. 
Meek Russell.

Miss Lucille Wilmeth boarded 
the bus at Brownwood Saturday 
to go to her school three miles 
from Midland. She was to stop 
over at Stanton to visit her 
friend, Mrs. Jake Glaze, who 
would drive her out to her school 
Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mr- Hubert Reeves 
went to Mullin Sunday to visit 
at the home of Mrs. Reeves’ pa­
rents, Mr and Mrs John Guth­
rie Mis,s Sybil Guthrie of San 
Antonio was also expected to be 
there.

Grandma Ivy returned Satur-

Mr. and Mrs. Will Crowder at 
Ridge While their she attended 
Bro Purr’s meeting at Ridge.

Mrs LuU Kelly, who was re­
ported sick last week. U better. 
She spent most of the week with 
her daughter, Mrs. Prank Crow­
der, at Oakland. While there 
she went to see a doctor, and she 
seems very much Improved. 
While at Oakland, she also visit­
ed her daughters, Mrs. Ross 
White and Mrs Loyd Neal.

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Egger and 
Ynelle, Mr. and Mrs. Orville Eg­
ger, and Mr. and Mrs. Billie Mc­
Nurlin and children visited at 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Ira 
Egger Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Crowder 
and children visited Mr. suid 
Mrs. Stanley Reevet Sunday af­
ternoon.

Mr and Mrs E. O. Dwyer and 
Mr. and Mrs J. R. Briley and 
Grace were guests for dinner at 
the WUmeth home Sunday after 
church.

The Thompson’s are leaving us 
soon. Mr. Thompson has secur­
ed a ranch Job In Bosque county.

J. R. Reeves U contemplating 
leasing the Thompson place.

Mr and Mrs Orville Egger have 
leased the White place for next 
year.

Louis Perkins has leased the 
Clifford Crowder place, and is to 
take possession Sept. IS.

Cecil Egger has a reputation 
for being an expert map-maker 
Dr May recently purchased a 
map of this community made by 
Cecil.

Mrs. Jim Wilmeth and Miss 
Bernice Wilmeth visited Mr and 
Mrs. Joe Horton at Bangs Sun­
day afternoon. Their daughter, 
Dula Zell Horton, who graduat­
ed at Bangs high school last 
spring, has recelvea a four years 
Coggln scholarship to Daniel 
Baker College. Dula Zell was 
bom  In this community and liv­
ed here a few years. We send 
her congratulations.

• ......... -

NEW

G reetins Cart
— for-

ALL OCCASIONS
We have Installed a new Greetini Cut 

Ulning all the newest designs In , ,

Birthday —  Friendship — 
sure —  Going Away —  Weddin,
valescent —  Birth Ann
Thank You CARDS.

ouncegj

H U D S O N  BRd
"What You Want, When Too Wist |J

Goldthwaite Texul

Alton F. Marrlcle la back at 
work at the Goldthwalte post 
office after a two weeks vacation 
He and his family visited rela­
tives at Idalou and Lubbock.

Edward Eugnth 
was confloid to 1̂  
last week. U n ;« 
and wlUnoDke«

O  H  7art)er;;^i 
outside of hu «on

r

day from spending the week with

Rudd Station, Texaco Gas and 
Oil Firestone Tires and Tuben. 
In the same old place.

------------ o------------

l/ooking for one more custom­
er. Ideal Watch Shop, next door 
to Key John.son I'sed Oar 
Building.

The Early Bird 
Coins the Casi)

ProflUble layers are on the Job during ik| i 
highest egg prices. They can’t make np for bd j 
on. 1

To get o ff to a good start and keep gei^g 
the Fall and early Winter months, birds wm h 
You can't get the eggs without it That's tbgl 
feed .MID-TEX EGG MA.SH. It wUI prodnet mu 
ter eggs and will keep up the health of yew flig

Bring us your POl'LTRY, EGGS, snd (KU|| 
fer top prices and give you prompt and ruanMuj

I V

G erald -W ork
Company
PHONE m

Goldthwaite, Texai

F R I E N D S * « «
Our Prices have been reduced even more and we invite yi 

to come in, look over Our stock and compare prices
Catsup2
Macaroni

8 oz.

bottle * 9 c  HOMINY 3 cans 13c Dukes or Durhad
7 packages . l i

Spaghet^ 2  boxes S c  G l a d i o i a  F lo u r FULL POUND

Looking for one more custom­
er. IdeaU Watch Shop, next door 
to Key Johnson Used Oar 
Building.

NEW BI RGERS
Ham Burgers. .  Cheese Burgers, | 
ChJekesi Burgers. Baron Burgers, 
Bin’s Special Bssrgers. .  All Itc 
I  for 25c. Buy them by the ssusk. 
Ma«M by BILL hbueelf,

COLGATE

Tooth Paste 
Pint Alcohol

18 c
9c

48-lbs.
24-lbs.

$1.35  
70c

Vanilla Wafers 1
NICE SIZE—

Maxwell House Coffee
‘Not the cheapest hut the Best »* O R A N G E S

i T i d A w c i i  n o u s e  L o r r e e  ---------------------------  " i c k  a í ^ m c

Regular or Drip lb. 25c Lifebuoy Soap 17c' —
GOODQ I t .  SOUR OR DILL—  < l  V I  U a U O a g ^  I»'*

oalad Dressing qt. P i p I r j p Q  |-|i. 1 sugar cured-̂
PURE CANE— CLOTH BAG—  _____________________"  * _  ^  Sliced Meat lb*

H i s  m H  M n  H I  M  •

Pork Sausage lb. 1

^ ^  G»ant Lye 3 cans 23c ßologna lb.

LONG & BERRY GoldthwfljTex$it
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Mr. and Mrs. D. L. Wheeler re­
turned Thursday, from Rankin, 
where they visited their sons. 
Mrs. Wheeler took sick while 
there but soon recovered.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Burnett 
and her sister, Mrs. H. C. Young 
of Killeen returned Monday 

I from a week’s visit In Odessa 
and other points.

Mrs. Marvin O'Quln and 
daughter. Miss Eloi.se o f Dallas, 
.spent last week with her aunt, 
Mrs. Walter Weatherby and 
family. Mr. Oquln and son Bil­
lie came Sunday for a few  days 
visit and Mrs. Oquln and Miss 
Elotse accompanied them home.

W. J. Weatherby and his 
daughter. Miss Billie and Ml&s 
Sarah Falrman spent Monday 
and Tuesday In Dallas.

Mrs. B M Palmer and son 
James Ray o f Ranger and Miss­
es Nina and Irma Chilton of 
Star spent the week end with 
their grandmother, Mrs. A H 
Chilton. Mrs. Palmer also visit­
ed with Mrs. P. O. Palmer and 
Mrs Bateman.

Mrs. L. J. Oartman and daugh­
ter, MLss LouLse and Miss Leona 
Riley motored to Brownwood 
Sunday afternoon.

Misses Estha and Loraine Kel­
ley Of Houston spent the week 
end with their parents, Mr and 
Mrs Jim Kelly.

Mrs. T. S. Oerald spent the 
week end with her son, Dewey 
Oerald and family at Caradan.

Mrs. Paul Bohel and daughter 
of Qalveston Is visiting Mrs. 
Emma Oltrogge and Mrs. Bill 
Fox.

Mt.ss Grace Patterson left Fri­
day for Vernon where she has 
been teaching for several years. 
She likes her Job better each 
year.

Tnomas V. Mahan of the U. S. 
Army at Fort Sam Houston Is 
spending his vacation with his 
father, B F Mahan and enjoy­
ing meeting old friends. Hl.s wife 
and Uttle daughter are expect- 

¡ed In any day now, to enjoy the 
.vacation with him.

B F. Oeeslln of Edinburg, who | 
spent several days here this 
week, left Thursday for Brady 
to visit his son Edward Oeeslln 
and family.

Fred and Ray Davee and their 
families of Hobb.s. N. M , spent 
the week end with their parents. 
Mr and Mrs Jess Davee.

Mr.«. A D Kames returned the 
latter part of the week from a 
vLslt with relatives In Fort 
Worth.

Mr. and Mrs. 8 E. Pa.ss o f Abi­
lene .spent the week end with his 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Pass 
and other relatives and friends.

Mr. ar.d Mr̂ ' Arthur Bryant 
and family attended the singing 
convention at Mullln Sunday and 
also visited her parents. Mr and 
Mrs Cun.ilngham at Trigger 
Mountain.

Mr. and Mrs. Wl'I Berry, Mr 
and Mrs Walker Berry and Mr 
and Mrs Burton Leverett spent 
Sunday In Eldorado with Mrs. 
Walker Berry’s brother, F H 
Watson, another brother Ross 
Watson from Oklahoma met 
with them and a most enjoyable 
day was spent.

MI'S Virginia Bowman left 
Tue«day for El Campo where she 
has accepted a position as Eng­
lish teacher in high school there 

Mrs Dan W'e.«terman returned 
Friday from San Angelo, where 
■she visited several weeks.

Mrs Ruby Sullivan left for 
San Angelo Friday after spend­
ing .several werks with her pa­
rents, Mr and Mrs F D Webb 

Mrs. L J. Oartman and daugh 
ters, Mlises Evelyn and Louise 
spent Thursday In Ballinger 
with relatives.

Jim Weatherby has had his 
home on Fisher Street re-shlng- 
led and the Interior redecorated 

Mr and Mrs. Walter Falrman 
had as dinner guests Monday 
evening. Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Cobbs and family of Kingsville, 
a nelce o f Mr. Fairman’s Mrs. 
Blossom Greenwood of San An- 

I tonlo. H A. Greenwood of Mc- 
! Klnny. Mr and Mrs. Henry 
I Painter, Miss Florence Oreen- 
I wood, and Donald and S. F. 
I Greenwood ail of Brownwood.
I Misses Evelyn Oartman and 
I Leona Riley spent Saturday In 
! PottsvlLe and Hamilton.

Mrs. R. L. Conro Is .somewhat' 
Improved this week. !

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Kilgore and 
baby daughter of Lullng arrived 
Saturday fpr a week’s visit with 
her parents, Mr. anti Mrs. Neal 
Dickerson.

Jeff Lowrle of Corpus Chrlstl 
spent Sunday and Monday here 
with hia grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jeff Prlddy and Mrs Mollle 
Lowrle.

Mr. and Mrsw Walter Falrman 
spent Sunday In Brownwood 
with relatives and friends.

L. J. Oartman took his daugh­
ter, MLss Evelyn to Sequin Sun­
day where she will teach In the 
.rubllc school.

Mrs. P. J. Spence of Fort 
Worth Is visiting her daughter, 
Mrs. Marvin Rudd.

Mrs E. L. Ham and two child­
ren and Mrs. H. H Smith of 
Sunaerton, Arlz., arrived Tues­
day for a visit with their parents, 
Mr and Mrs. Jake Kirby.

Mr. and Mrs. I. L Allard and

Center City
By Mrs. J. M. Oglesby

Since a number have remind­
ed me they miss the Center City 
news, will send In the happen­
ings this week.

Everybody Is busy—not with
cotton picking, but saving of feed 
and preparing for school, etc. 
Our school began Monday with 
Profs. Blackwell and Kirby, 
Misses Oeeslln and Ware as 
teachers. Miss Ware Is the only 
new teacher and we hope that 
we can have another good 
school year, and that much good 
work will be accomplished with 
the pupils.

Students going away to school 
are Payne Coffman, Deward 
Atchison, Missess Hulda Carter 
and Wilma Lee. Fayne goes to 
StephenvUle and the others to 
Brownwood.

Quite a number of the Baptist 
members attended and enjoyed 
the Association at Rock Springs

son and his friend. Mr. and Mrs. ! iMt Friday.
! Jake Sexton and daughter Ma- 
jrlan and mother, Mr.-. Mallle 
; Sexton, all of Dallas, .spent the 
week end with relatives here.

Orville Egger ot the ERxmy 
community called at The Elagle 
office on business, Wednesday, 
and reported that section of 
Mills couotv in good condition 
with the exception of no cotton.

Mr. and Mrx. D W Walker 
and two sons at Ear. Angelo visit- 
over the week end with her sla­
ter, Mrs J. T. Morris and family.

Mr. and Mrs. L. C Anderson 
and Miss El.de Hill of Austin 
spent the week end and Labor 
Day, Monday, with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Oeo. Hill and fami­
ly, Miss Gwendolyn Hill, sister 
c f  the ladles, returned to Austin 
with them for a visit.

Travis Meeks attended the

Mrs. Wilbur Waggoner and lit 
tie sons accompanied her 
brother, J. Y. Hamilton, on a 
visit with their father, Mr. Oltte 
Hamilton and family and their 
brother Esteen and family and 
also visited their sister. They 
had a delightful trip

Mrs. Harrison and grandson 
of Fort Worth visited In the Og­
lesby home Friday night and 
Saturday.

Miss Gladys Casbeer went to 
Long Cove, where she teaches 
this year and began her work 
Monday.

Mtss Clara Blackwell began 
teaching at Kelly last Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Evans and 
Miss Gladys and Gladys Evelyn 
and Wanda Margaret Evans 
spent several days with Mr. and 
Mrs. Oscar Hill at their old

our midst.
Mrs. Frank Karnes Is making 

an extended visit in San AnUmlu 
and other places of Interest. Her 
sen.Z. takes care of the home 
place In her absence.

Mrs Toqi B'>oker visited her 
mother, Mrs. McNeil at North 
Bennett last week. While there 
.sparks from the flue ignited 
shingles on the roof near and 
quite a bit of damage was done 
before the fire was extinguished. 
Discovery was made as the fam­
ily was at the table at the noon 
hour, by shingles falling on the 
ceiling above. Clarence Oeeslln 
arrived Immediately and wrlth a 
handy ladder, a stock trough of 
water nearby, the hou.se was sav­
ed.

Mi.ss Naomi Langford has ac­
cepted a position In a beauty 
shop In Lometa.

This community was saddened 
when news reached here early 
Tuesday morning that John M 
Harris had pa.ssed away at his 
home north of us. Mr. Harris 
was always known for his love 
for Justice. Hts wise council has 
helped many and his host of 
friends Join In extending sym­
pathy to Mrs. Harris and child­
ren In this their dark hour.

Mr. and Mrs. Ben Littlepage 
John Head and Miss Oertrude 
Head, arrived the early part of 
last week for a visit with rela­
tives. Miss Oertrude remained 
with her sister, Mrs. McNeil, 
while the others returned to 
their homes at Mineral Wells and 
Weatherford.

Mrs. Allen Carter and

90 Million Acres 
In Soil Program 
In Texas District

th0
1

With every county In 
state participating In the 
range program, approximately 
90,000,000 acres will be involved 
in the current sub.sldy schedule, 
according; to R. M Human, state 
range performance supervisor.

Mr Burnan. Is a resident o f  
Marble Falla, where his head­
quarters are located He recent­
ly made a tour of West Texas 
ranges.

In the ranch program last 
year—first year of the program 
In Texas—there were 171 coun­
ties participating. Burnan said 

Wells and tanks have been 
constructed In West Texas large­
ly as compliance In the program 
and now the performance trend 
U toward contour ridging, ter­
racing and spreader dam con ­
struction.

----------- (V------------

New Orleans lies below the level 
of the Mississippi at high water.

Hulda accompanied by Mrs. 
Paul Jones, spent several days 
visiting at Rising Star.

Dogs got In the herd of sheej» 
owned by Z Karnes and klUed 
nine, five died soon after a n d  
about that number were tom  >9 
bsdly It is feared they will n o t  
recover. This Is a severe loss 
and it is hoped these dogs c a d  
be killed before other herds xrw 

Miss I damaged.

funeral In Florence Thursday of ' borne place.
his cousin, Mrs. Glen Strickland 
of Fort Worth, who died In a 
Gainesville hospital 'Tuesday 
from Injuries received In an 
automobile accident on the 
Texas-Oklahoma highway bridge 
Monday night. Mr Meeks’ un­
cle and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. T. F

Miss Ware Is spending the win­
ter In the J. N. Coffman home.

Jno. L. House, a former Army 
boy. Is at heme with his parents. 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom House,

Prof. Horace Cooke visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Wilbur Waggoner Sun­
day. Mr. Cooke was a much-

Cotten, and their son. Carl, were 1 loved teacher here several years 
injured severely In the wreck. | ago and he is always welcome In

lit
H OW ARD PAYN E COLLEGE 

Yellow Jackets 
1938 Schedule

N. Tex. State Teachers BruwnwtMid
Sw. Tex. St. Teachers San .Marcos
Trinity ITniversity Brownwood
Texas Wesleyan CoHegr ... Fort Worth
Austin CoHege Sherman
McMurry College . . . .  Abilene
Abilene Christian College Brownwood
.Arkansas State Teachers Col. Little Rock
St. Edward’s I’niversity .. Brownwood
Southwestern rniversity Brownwood
llardin-Simmons I'niversity . .  Brownwood

—NIGHT GAMES

♦Sept. 16 ___
Sept 23 _____
"Sept. 39 ____
October 8 . . .
October If 
October 22 
♦October 28 
November 3 
November 11 
November 24 
December 3 __

jn«»ltuial S»e.

' J o » ,

1« Tks
th* UUs
«ocotiso

«*XUTK»

DRESSED FRYERS
Home-raised— Fattened

ASSORTED—

LUNCH MEATS, lb. 20c

LARGE SIZE PURE MAID

Lemons doz. 12c English Peas 15 oz. 
can

GRAPES Dried Peaches
V 7 a i 2  l b s .  2 S c  *  0 ® « ” ^  « «  5 P o u n d s  . . . .  5 5 c
SUGAR CURED ARM OUR’S

I  CRYSTAL W H ITE—

S q u a r e s  1th 21c Peanut Butter, short quart l9c jS o a p  5 l)ars
CHUM HUFF’S—

S A L M O N
3  reg. size cans 2 5 C

Don’t overlook this Bargain

Folger’ s Dripmaker jSPAGHETTI, giant can 10c
- - SALE -  -  I CHUCK W AGON —

9 8 c  BEANS, 2 reg. cans 15c
W ORLD OVER—

1-lb. Folger’s C offee and 
1-1938 Dripmaker, only

Regular $1.65 Value

C o f f e e  2 lbs. 2 9 c ¡LETTUCE 2  heads
Large, Firm Heads

COUNTRY GENTLEMAN—

TOBACCO, big bale bag
Regular 10c Bag FREE!!

25c
BALLOON—

Soap Flakes, 5 lb. box only 36c

21 OZ. JAR—

APPLE SAUCE, only 10c
GULF—

FLY SPRAY, pint 12c

EXTRA BRIGHT—

DRIED APPLES, 5 lbs.
CHOICE PROLIFIC—

RICE 2  lbs. IOC
MORTON’i

SALT, 4 lb. bag

5 )
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RANK DISCRIMINATION
Congre.s.sman Marvin Jones of Texas is on the righ* t.... ' 1 

his efforts to remove the barriers to .Southern prosperity v..i.-. i 
have been caused by the rankly unfair freight rates which ;>enal-1 
Jae Texa.s farmers and Texas consumers. Ho* serious the .«itua-l 
Hon Is has been made clear by Mr. Jone^ as fo'lews: '

"W'hen farm Implemcpts, iron and steel, and 
other manufactured commsditie- are shipped abroad, 
reduced freight rates are allowed t: the point of ex­
port. whereas on mast farm ccmmodltles, especially 
cotton and wheat, little if any export rate reductlon.s 
are allowed '

"As Industry has these reduced export rates, why 
should not the .«ame reductions be given wheat and 
cotten as a matter of simple justice?

• When farm machinery is shipped, the following 
rates prevail:

Dome.<tic rate Export 1
Per. cwt. Per. cwt.

Indianapolis to Galveston 1 04 44
Indianapolis to New Orleans 75 44
Chicago to Hou.ston 1 05 471;
Chicago to New Orlf ins 80 47 ';
Moline. Ills, to Houston 1 02 47'x

The Policy Is Sound Chicago’s Method

IH7HI U-Í AlUKlHS'isO“
A wee< A *sK sto tf^ " yfAAiy
Dues. rveny

A 9oyef 5 0 " /

Millf County Has 
Gcod Infant Record

On iron and stei'. the follo*1ng rates prevail:
Chicago to San Francisco 1 02 40
Gary Indiana, to New York 47 34
Pittsburg. Pa . to New York 33 20

I cautions against complications 
i !o  advanced and so avail- 
 ̂ able as they are today However. 
: In spite of the Imprcvement In 

•Tr. T \.i during 1917 698 the techniques Involved and the
mo'h'-'T Uat their lives through | ;her developm°nt of antlsep- 
chl'dblrth and associated c""dl-1 jtj contro', the maternal mor-

tallty figures pathetically Indl

"In other words 2 plows shipped from Moline. 
Illlnol.s. to Houston. Texas, loaded on the same plat­
form, unloaded on the same dock.the cue to be u.sed 
by a Texa.s farmer pays a freight rate of SI 02 p-r 
cwt.; ’ he one being shipped abroad pays a freight 
rate j 47'-c per cwt.”

This di.scriminatlon which averages 79 per cent has beer, 
known for a long time, but for one reason or another, nothing 
could be done about It. Now with the authority granted by the 
new farm bill, the Secretary of Agriculture Is empowered to cor­
rect dlscrimlnatlcns such as these. If enough pre.ssure can be

tilín* 
h*bi 
3 972 
•’■hi -e

R71
and

Fa’ aity struck 
tinder ,n‘ year of ag 
:rfa"t= tver? ’ ill 
f t c ‘ " beerme p rtlctarlv

; i f*S"g n /en  It i ' rfa'Iged 
a* •'■j't tw -thirds of thi* 

mothf.-hood mora’lty cou'd have 
been av tired.’’ ■•’ atis Dr. Geo W 
Cox. .'tit* health officer.

Mil's county had 138 tctal live 
births, of which '.35 wer* white. 
1 wa.s negro, and 2 were Mexi­
can; 78 of the Infants wer» male 

Drought in Washington to make officials there take notice of the ¡and 60 fema’e. Physicians at- 
Hluation. there Is no doubt but remedial action can be secured tended the births of 137 Infants, 
aromptly , and a midwife attended 1 birth;

While we have no direct expression from him, we are confl- all 138 births were at heme; 1 
dent that our own Congres-sman. Judge Chas L South of Cole- child was stillborn, giving the 
man. Is equally Interested in secunng better rates for Texas pro­
ducers and consumers. It will help him in his efforts to secure 
;hem. if vou will write him your views on the matter.

I cate that medical knowledge 
alcne cannet solve the problem,” 
Dr Ccx further stated, 

i "Ccnfrally speaking. Innocent 
\ or wilful neglect is largely re- 
i sDonsible for the preventable 
maternal deaths. It Is to be em-

i phaslzed that the proper time 
for expectant mothers to seek 
medical attention Is when the 
expectancy Is first realized.

"Indeed, prenatal care is the 
great defense against any of the 
conditions that cause tragedy at 
birth. Consequently, expectant

The appeal of old-age pensions 
Is no phenomenon. Every man 
who survives must achieve old 
age and few can amass a suffi­
cient reserve to yield even In 
sound Investing hands an In­
come equivalent to that of earn­
ing years. Few indeed will have 
anything at all In old age If the 
familiar acturlal Ubles are well 
founded. The Insurance sales­
men have long argued this as 
the reason for taking out insur­
ance against the Inevitable 
rainy day while earning. The 
politicians have simply Improv­
ed on this by making old-age the 
basis for vote getting.

Fundamentally old-age pen­
sions in principle are sound 
enough We have always had It 
In one form or another. Out­
side of the many fine American 
families who accept the logical 
responsibility of caring for their 
own. there have always been 
many deserving oldsters with 
nowhere to turn. Whether we 
give them Institutional care or 
a pension, the results amount to 
the same. The Justice o f assur­
ing a decent o:d age to all who 
have met the responsibilities ot 
earning lifetime is beyond evil 
The chief quarrel with old-age 
pensions Is that little effort has 
been made to separate the sheep 
from the goats. You see the 
goats have votes, too. and some­
times the more forcefully pul 
ones.

It is to be hoped that the old- 
age pension has come to stay. 
For sUy It should. We may even 
owe something to the star-eyed 
Townsend planners, all ot the 
odds and ends of Impossible, Im- 
pracUble plans for paying some 
large sum somehow, we may 
even owe something to the poli­
ticians for making old-age care 
a concrete fact In spite of the 
ways they have exploited. But 
the great task before the Nation 
now Is to separate sound old-age 
care from the politicians, from 
the political racketeers. from 
slush fund relief, to consider and 
adjust It as a necessary part of

LESSO!' HAHOLD I ' j |

When the University of Chica­
go In 1929 chose thirty-year-old 
Robert M Hutchins president, 
older pedagogues were amazed 
Boy prodigy he was called, and 
boy prodigies have a way of 
blowing up An article In the 
Ladles Home Journal Is high In 
praise of Hutchins, however; he 
has made his university an In­
stitution of learning, not a pic­
nic ground for socialites.

Youthful, brilliant and vigor- 
OU.S. Hutchins' only method Is to 
teach students to think. It Is 
hard to believe, but students In 
that school are asking that the 
library be kept open longer; are 
writing papers on deep subjects 
not required; are taking college 
books with them on their vaca­
tions.

It Is a relatively simple ta'k. 
Hutchins believes, to Inspire 
.•tudents to think correctly. Why 
not talk and read about politics 
history and science Instead cl 
swing bands and football? At 
Chicago classes are crowded with 
students sitting on the floors to 
hear lectures. Hutchins has con 
vinced them that what they 
need Is a definite philosophy of 
life that will equip them to fare 
the hazards of a changing world. 
Read, read and read more, he 
tells them—classics, history 
logic, biology.A-not movie maga­
zines and dime novels.

Next month thousands of Tex­
as students will enter college 
They can profit from Hutchins' 
advice A rich life full o f oppor­
tunity Is ahead—an opportunity 
to accumulate riches that can­
not be taken away. Or as anoth­
er educator puts it, “ to develop 
reserves other than bank re- 
serves.” --Oallas News.

Lesson for ¡

SAI’L: k o tA ljn

lesson TZxtj ». I
golden text iw

Harmony Needed

A STRAW  IN THE WIND
ty rule would be adopted more 
generally, the present maternal

For those who have been worried by the Inroads of Commun­
ism and other beliefs alien to real Americanism, here are at least 
some crumbs of comfort from the erstwhile “ liberal" Congress­
man recently defeated In his campaign for renomlnatlon and 
re-election:

•‘Although local issues played an important part In my defeat. 
H seems to me that it also reflected a growing national attitude 
That is an attitude of belief in and willingness to fight foi Am;r- 
tcanlsm as against all the other Isms.

“The Americanism of some of my backers was questioned 
The voters were frightened, not by me but by my supporters. They 
voted against me

“ I see that trend developing all over the country. And I pre­

county a rate of .7 per 100 live 
births, and 7 children died under 
one year cf age. a rate of 50 7 per 
1000 live births,

"The Elate Health Department 
wishes to call attention to the 
fact that Texas Is at last ap­
proaching the national average 
of Infant and maternal mortali­
ty. In 1933 the nation as a whole rate, thoughtful and co­

mother, should ̂ c e  themselves of U f™ n t U  we do
under the supervision of a phy-' 
slclan at the beginning of the 
term If this fundamental safe-

that both the Natkw and old- 
age pensions will suffer.

—D allu  News.

■"•"‘“ "Friendly H and-CIup
"As one authority aptly states,

To cut the appalling maternity

had a maternal mortality of 62 
while Texa.s' rate was 77; In 
1934 the U. S. had a rate of 59 
and Texas 73; in 1936 the nation 
had an averaqe t f  58 and Tex­
as’ was 69 The national aver­
age for 1937 Is as yet unavail­
able but Texas has come down 
to 59. The infant mortality ta- 
b'e presents a similar compart

operative initiative most orlgl 
nate in the home.’ In other 
words, science had done its part, 
now the prospective mothers 
must do theirs."

------------o

vllct that within the next eighteen months or two years this i *oti- Advancing public health
qouiitry will see a wave of Americanism such as it has never seen 
before .’■

Anc’.her point worth noting is the fact that the five Texas 
Oongre.* men who were committee chairmen, and who were 
hlackllsted by the C I O were renominated just the same. 
Doubtless they will develop ear trouble when C. I. O. lobbyists ask 
hem for favors next .?es,slon.

---------------- o----------------

THE HIGH COST OF BUSINESS
A .'urvey just completed by the American Federation of In­

vestors re\-eals that 150 Industrial corporations In the United 
States, employing 3.171.250 persons, paid $1.631.000.000 in taxes 
last year—an lncrea.se of almost a bll’.lon dollars In five years 
(the 1932 tax burden of the same 150 corporations was $681.648.-
M 6 1 .

The 1937 tax payment represented an average of $514 paid 
tor each employee and $291 for every common stockholder. One

practices, better pre-natal and 
post-natal care, and better hy­
gienic conditions contribute to 
this steadily diminishing per­
centage of Texas mothers and 
children lost in chi’dblrth 

"Never before In the history 
of cbstetrlcs have scientific pre-

The U. S. Department of Ag­
riculture is trying to produce a 
watermelon that will fit into the 
family Icebox. Tiie new melon 
will also be sweeter, dlsesise-re- 
.slstant and a better shipper. A 
cross with an African melon 
gives proml.se

--------  n------------

If Christian nations were na­
tions of Christians there would 
be no wars.- Soame Jenyns.

company, employing more than 5000 workers, paid a tax equall­
ing $4.580 frr each of Its employees. In other words, that is how 
much it cost the employer In taxes alone to keep his plant open 
and provide jobs for his employees.

The alarming Increase In business taxation, we believe, is a 
definite threat to the whole nation, for, if business men are to 
remain in bu.siness, profits must be sufficient to pay not only 
taxes, but wages to workers and dividends to the Investors also.

When taxes equal the income of a busines.-man, where is he 
expected to find the money to pay wages to employees?

T h e r e  Is no International 
boundary like It, anywhere In the 
world, that five thousand-mile 
line separating the United States 
and Canada. FOr much of the 
way It is Invisible save for an oc- 
csistonal marker such as we see 
at the borders o f States In the 
Union. There are no Maginot 
lines no Siegfried line defenses 
behind those borders. Instead 
there Is free and friendly com ­
munication, mutual confidence 
and repsect. Once again the 
two countries are celebrating 
today their era of friendly rela­
tions, now passing the 124-year 
mark. There Is no fear or sug­
gestion o f fear that those rela­
tions will be strained In the years 
to come. 'The President of the 
United States and the Prime 
Minister of Canada, meeting for 
the dedication of another Inter­
national bridge, commend the 
example of their countries to the 
fear-ridden. hate-obse.ssed. ar­
mament-burdened lands of the 
Old World.—Minneapolis Jour­
nal.

4>.
Safety pins were first devised 

by Walter Hunt In 1849.

Jerry Sadler, nominee for the 
railroad commission, and Oerald 
Mann, who will be the next at­
torney general, have announc­
ed they will make no effort to 
block the adoption of the W. Lee 
ODaniel program at the Beau­
mont convention nest month.

Both deserve congratulations 
for their willingness to forget 
political differences In the in­
terest of harmony. If their sup­
porters follow their example, 
the Beaumont meeting will be 
harmonious and no obstacles will 
be placed In Mr. ODanlel’s path 
before he assumes office.

The State convention always Is 
the govenor-nominee’s party. It 
provides an opportunity for him 
to place his program before the 
people. In addition, it heals 
many of the wounds left by 
heated primary campaigns.

Mr. O ’Daniel won the guber 
natorlal nomination in such 
convincing fashion he deserves 
cooperation from the entire 
Democratic party, not only at 
Beaumont but after he assumes 
office on January 1.

Many pressing problems con­
front him. If a sound solution 
is to be found, all Texans must 
give horn their support, coopera­
tion and advice.

The movement to weld Texas 
Democracy Into a unified whole 
may well begin at Beaumont. For 
a rift to develop there would be 
unfortunate Indeed.

Mr. Sadler and Mr. Mann ten­
dered their cooperation quickly, 
which should provide an unmis­
takable cue for the hundreds of 
thousands of voters who made 
their victories last Saturday 
possible —Houston Post.

t h e  CLANCY KIDS Then you have a grouen for tha day. By m ?CY L. CROSBY
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More than 4100 votes were 
polled In Comanche County Sat­
urday In the run-off primary 
when two new county officers 
were nominated and a new Stat? 
S e n a t o r  and Repre.sentatlve 
named.

Frank Howlngton for Repre­
sentative led the ticket with 2.805 
votes to 1,194 for Tolbert Patter­
son of Mullln, Incumbent. How- 
Ington trailed Patterson by less 
than 100 votes In Mills county 
and In the two counties had a 
majority o f more than 1.500.

For State Senator, Penrose 
Metcalfe trailed Ross Pre.scott 
In the county. 1721 to 2196. bu* 
won the nomination over the 
25th District by more than 2200 
votes majority over Pre,scott.

The first crop of 1938 peanut- 
In Comanche county sold this 
year were raised by Bill Vine­
yard o f the Sweetwater com ­
munity. Mr. Vineyard brought 
In 240 bushels of these peanuts: 
the average yield per acre was 
about thirty bushels. The price 
paid for these nuts was 75c per 
bushel, being slightly under last 
year’s price.

Hilton Burks, secretay of the 
Comanche Chamber o f Com-1 
merce, also Is a cotton farm er,, 
finds It pays to poison cotton | 
against Insects and other pests.' 
Mr. Burks already has poisoned 1 
his cotton five times and as a | 
result has hls stalks well loaded i 
with bolls, squares, and blooms | 
from top to bottom with an ex­
tra good stalk.

Approximately thirty-five men 
are now working out twice daily 
under Coach Glenn Frazier and 
Line Coach Bull Fletcher, In or­
der to get the *38 Indians into 
shape for their first football 
game, September 26.

The school faculty In Coman­
che this year will number thirty, 
the largest In the history of the 
School and nine more than when 
Superintendent Bramblette tock 
charge o f the schools three years 
ago, during which time the scho­
lastic enrollment has nearly 
doubled.

-------- 0------------

San Saba
! A quarantine restriction was 
jccmpleted and In effect Tuesday!
! afternoon, wltlj respect to a n - ' 
thrax. In this county In an aren 

¡extending along Highway 81. | 
north to the Colorado River, west 
to Regency Bridge and all ea.st 
of the Old Brownwood Read, all 
roads touching this area are In­
cluded in the quarantine. In 
this area guards will be station­
ed to prevent the movement of 
all livestock from It until the 
quarantine is lifted. Livestock 
men In the quarantined area 
.should consult state veterinarian 
In charge. Dr. L. O Cloud, before 
Thaxton stated yesterday.

Many people of San Saba wort- 
saddened Sunday morning when 
a telegram came announcing the 
death, In San Antonio, o f Mrs. 
H. E. Draper, wife of the late 
Rev. H. E. Draper who at one 
time wa.s pastor of the local 
Methodist Church, and durlne 
whose pastorate the present 
Methodist Church was construct­
ed.

Reports to the county agent's 
office are to the effect that the 
hog cholera disease seems to be 
spreading over the county. New 
outbreaks are reported dally. 
County Agent Tisdale advises 
that the county will likely be 
placed under quarantine if this 
has not already been done,

Mrs. Amelia Cowan will have 
as her guests over the week end 
her son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Joseph B. Cowan, who are re­
turning to Texas from Pico. Cal., 
where they have been associat­
ed with a newspap>er for the past 
year. Mr. Cowan will begin hls 
duties In Texas Tech at Lubbock 
with the opening of the term 
next month, serving In the jour­
nalism department.

Capt, and Mrs. Douglas Smith

volumes of experience. He doesn't 
dsih off hls I;^cs in inspired mo­
ments. Struxxle snd sweat with 
meter snd rhyme , . . perspiration, 
not Inspiration . . « make for suc­
cessful soncwritinc. Believe this on 
the suthorit; of no less a person- 
see of the songwriting fraternity 
than Edgar Leslie, for thirty years 
one of the most successful of his 
profession, snd for many years A 
leading member of the Board of Di­
rectors of th* American Society of 
Composers. Authors and Publishers.

Leslie bad written many popular 
song parodies for dialect comedians, 
thirty years ago. when he created 
bis original smash hit, Tm a Yid- 
disher Cowboy " He followed this 
quickly by a collaboration with Irv­
ing Berlin — "Sadie Salome, Co 
Home" These two numbers de6- 
nitely established him as an up-and- 
coming author of popular song

Hits multiplied. "Oet Out snd Get 
Under." "When Crown Up Ladies 
Act Like Babies," "America, I Love 
You." "California and You." "Oh. 
What a Pal Was MarF’ snd "Dirty 
Hands. Dirty Face” followed in 
quick succession.

Harry Warren and he wrote "By 
the River St. Marie," and left It 
forgotten. In manuscript form, tor 
eight years It emerged from 
oblivion to become one of the great 
hits of recent years. "Among My 
Souvenirs" was written In London 
to the music of "Horatio Nichols.' 
the composer being lu reality a 
leading English music publisher. 
Lawrence Wright Leslie has writ­
ten songs with Walter Donaldson 
Jimmy Monaco and many otlicra

Recently be teamed with an old

friend, Joseph Burke, popular song 
composer Six times In two years 
their creations have led the country 
in popularity. "In a Little Gypsy 
Tea Room." "On Treasure Island.” 
A Little Bit independent,” "Moon 

Over Miami." "Robins and Roses" 
and "It Looks Like Rain in Cherry 
Blossom Lane” reveal the magic 
touch of this gifted pair. "At a Per­
fume Counter” la one of their latest

Songs For Youtti
Leslie has evolved a practical 

philosophy of songwriting He be­
lieves the songwriter must address 
himself to youth, that the song 
must carry a simple and direct mes­
sage. It should be easy to slug, and 
he points out that popular songs 
must compete with the movies . . . 
that they must paint an attractive 
word picture. ^

Leslie Is a thoroughgoing New 
Yorker Hla grandparents lived In 
Seventy-first Street when It was 
known as Bloumlngdale Road, and 
they used to spend their summers 
at a cottage In Chelsea (Twenty- 
third Street) Happily married 
twenty-ore years, he now lives In a 
mldtown Lolef, usually retires 
early

Hu fulliiws deep-sua ffshing and 
golf, and enjoys sea voyages. HI* 
favorite ouidooi sport—as a spec­
tator—ts polo In the writing ol 
songs he goes into the more mun­
dane memoric;- and experiences ol 
hls life. Into things mure In touch 
with America ns It Is to the grea>

A large number of people visit­
ed the W. F & J. F Barnes new 
plant upon Its formal oprnlng 
Friday, Aug. 26. Jack Moore, 
local manager, stated that 449 
adults registered during the day, 
and, counting the children, pro­
bably 900 or more people Inspect 
ftd their new quarters on thl-s (x;- 
casion. .

District Court convened In 
Hamilton Monday with Judge R.
R. Cross presiding.

The H ’ milnn inuniclpa. swim­
ming pool is nearing completion 

' The concrete worg on the pool 
I proper has be n completed, but 
1 it is yet to be painted. The 
‘ building to hou.se the filtering 
plant Is under construction and 
the filter plant and circulating 
system is expected to be com- 

I pleted by the middle of Septem­
ber.

Hamilton’s first football game 
of the season will be against 
Goldthwalte on Friday night.
September 16. at Fair Park field 
here, .«-hould provf quite Inter­
esting from two points of view.
In the first place it will give the 
public some Id'-a of the strength 
of the team, answering to a cer­
tain extent the question of 

, whether the Bulldogs can click 
'Without Cathey and Biansit. In 

I the second place it will renew a 
, rivalry of long standing between 
I the school:. Back In the days 
I when football was not so tho- 
I roughly organized and was a 
tougher game along the side­
lines, Hamilton and Goldthwalte 
had some exciting afternoons 
together. Though all that Is 
gone, and rightly so, a keen ri­
valry still exists.—County News. the "world's »au'c-st ar.d most

________ Q___ ____  I beautiful fair" during it- fifty
jyfars, with a monument to b." 
unveiled on opening day, Satur­
day, October 8, which is also 
Press Day.

! L. ery newt paper !n T rx i-i^ a ’- 
bren invited to t;nd in a f\ n t 
r - ' 'e  o f Its paper, up:n which i 

;h a ; bjen publi h 'd  a story on 
county Rural Electrification C o - 't i ,  community, which will be 
operative electric line; by the ] - i -e -d  In a metal cheit and plac- - 
H. J. Hall Construction Com- , jj ^ crypt under the tablet 
pany, according to Sam R. Hale, I "acknowledging a debt of gratl- 
superlntcndent for the coopera- | »ude to the Press of Texas "

I T.ie monument will stand eight 
Two carloads of equipment and ffpt tall on a ba‘ e 'ix  feet in

BILL’S CAFE SANUWICHM * 
VirgUiia Ham, CombinattMki 
Boiled or Baked Ham, ChirkM 
Salad, Pimento CbecKC, Fit BaF» 
B Q, Chicken Fried Steak, ito

! i 1895 i m

I J. N. KEESE
I Marble and Granite Memoriala 
I Bc.<-t Materials and Work- 
I manship.
I My i5 years study and ex 
 ̂perienre at your service, 
j Prices Low
i See me before plaring yoi 
• order.

l-'islier St., Goldthwalte, Text
I

»•

The Stat? Fair ci Texas will 
honor Its founder', and pay a 
:rlbute to the newspapers ol 
Texas for their success in bulld-

Work on Coleman 
Electric Line Begins

Actual construction work will 
begin Monday mcrnlng on the

many pol*s have arrived and a 
crew of between 50 and 60 men 
wa.s expected to begin their work 
last Monday morning.

O-

height. It will be finished in 
sand and ground granite. The 
monument Is being executed by 
Jose Martin and Roual Jos.set.

Wátch-Your.
llH p  H ir m  th è  Lèi

o f  llM rm fut lloily ante 
Your ktdnvjra are tonattfiUy ftlU'-'flÉ vasi« mattar from tk« blood straBnt kidne/B »omptime« lag in iheir not art aa Natura intx-::;. fall ta Biv̂ vp impunti«* tka<* if mainad* pounti thr syitem and upwt ika wham iHKly raarhin*-ry.Syirptoma may b« nagr̂ ng barkarlHk pertitirat kradarhc. altari' > of du^mi^ grtling up PifbtB, ««rMing, p\i4Ht*ÌP under (Jm «yc*—a f««Img o4 aiiai«Ky and ìom of p«p and MrengtJk* Oihtr Btgna of kidi.ry or tladd«« dia» «ird«r may b« buraing, aeanty or ta# Ircnurni urination.TK4*:eskould be no d->ubt that prwm̂  tpratmtnt la wìaer titan n«>ttrct. Oa# 

¡tomm'9 FitU. Ooan'a hav* bnèn wiaataid nrv frioods fur m<>r« tbaa (orty y la They havo a nation-aidr rnmtacita ' Ar« r«‘eomaiand«d by gra'.rfuJ oì̂ jpkolka rotiRtry ovar. A$k iNntr angAterf

DOiìNSfllUS
WHERE doFRECKLESgo 
WHEN OTHINE isusEor

ft's Am azing to Matty
For nearly 30 years Otliinc bs6 
bf<-n “ chasing freckles“  wo4 
ligh ten in g  sun-tanned skies*

hero Jo the fret kles and t«B 
go? They mildly flake av*ay vvitk 
the nightly use of this d,t.ia<y 
rrcaiii. Satisfy yourself, as tlsom 
sands do each year. The use A  
one jar nutsl please yon . . . 
your^moiiey will he refuuil*»C* 
Your hx-al druggist has < itlisB* 
...n r he will glatlly get it for  y<

mass And h>. writes to please them 
JJasic Features £ Photo Syndlrafe

T- c. graves
Dentist
X-RAY 

P« over Piggiy w in t f
«“Wi: 9-iJ: 1 . , ^  

Office, 237R Rm . 
r*oWthwaite. Texsa

Lometa
) The first bale of 1938 cotton 
I WO' brought in last Friday by 
E’i i “ V.’hltehead of the Chadwick
cc-:r.muii.ty.

I The bale was ginned at Ma.son 
¡gin .tnd weighed 497, and so far 
has not been sold.

Work .:r repairing Red Bluff 
bridge Is going along rapidly 
and po.v'lbly will be completed 
this vepi- If they can get th: 
pile driver out there.

Mr-. W M. Swain has returned 
fr"m Hoii.'ton where .she has been 
at the bed.side of her si'ter 
Mr.e. F. W. Ludtke who Is lU in 
the Mfthodlst Hospital there. 
I.ast reports that she was im­
proving s'owly,

Mi-is Naomi Langford of Cen­
ter City, has taken charge cf
Mr:. Ross' Beauty Parlor, as
chief ofierator. Miss Anken has 
retunicd to her home at Ba'trop, 
where she has accepted a po.'l- 
tlon.—Rejjorter.

One of the finest beache.s li­
the world, where tourists go in 
thousands but which Is never 
•■rowded, Is at Fano in Denmark 
The beach ts eight miles long 
and half a mile broad, and firm 
enough for auto races.

RIDE THE BUS
CKE.A.MER ST.AGE I.INE

.North Bound—
Lv. Goldthnaite 11:20 a. m.

Leon and Eastland and con­
necting points.

South Bound—
Lv. Goldthwalte 12:40 p. m.

For San Saba, Llano, F'red- 
ericksburg and San Antonie 
and connecting points.

Basses stop at Clements Dru; 
Store and Saylor Hotel.

Brownwood
Brown County Water Improve­

ment District No. 1 Monday night 
awarded a contract for Unit 3 of 
the million-dollar Lake Brown­
wood Irrigation project to Cage 
Brothers and L. A. Turner, Bis­
hop, Texas. The firm agreed to 
have the work completed In 275 
days.

Welcome news to Brown coun­
ty agriculture this week was the 
annottneement that the CCC Soli 

and family will leave New York ! Conservation camp 3818-V, lo-
for Haiti, where Capt. Smith 
will be military advisor to the 
Army there.

Capt. Smith Is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. W. A. Smith of this 
city, and the twin brother of 
Cecil B. Smith of Temple.

—News
-----------------o

Materials commonly used for 
protecting concrete while curing 
are canvas, burlap, boards, straw, 
and layers of moist sand.

cated In Fourth street In Brown­
wood, will remain here for an 
extended six months period be- 
glnnnlg October 1. The camp Is 
run on a six months basis and 
the present extension will ex­
pire September 30.

Fred Andrews, teller of the 
Citizens National Bank at Brown 
wood, early TThursday admitted 
shortages totaling $4.846.49, and 
left for Dallas to surrender to 
Federal authorities—Banner.
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Star
Ml«. Dora Good*

Just a few lines this morning 
♦» lo l you know that we are still 
e »  the map. The weather has 
b«*-ii hot. the chores unending, 
and energy and ambition at low 
e*b Ewn the choicest pot 
plants eo begging for attention. 
Fersimally I don’t like hot w — - 
ther, but the rest family prefer 
the Imperial Valley f^r ., place

accompanied by Wendell Hamll-1 Bulls Creek 
ton who Is continuing hU work I Sheppard
at the A&M College i ’ ____

School opened Monday with 
much interest, and we hope for a 
very successful year.

Mrs. Pearl Chlldre and son. 
James, have returned from East 
Texas where she spent the sum­
mer with her parents, and ex- 
»'-'■ts to ■’ t ' Coahoma where

I .1 .«ix-nd the winter near 
h er  chl’ drrn

Miis Lyda Lee Arm.strong Iso f  abode. It’s be.st. of course.,. 
that we are aU not alike in our! 
likes and dislikes r 'he whole 
«le*rt .section of our country
would be over-cri V- . <d or the 
North Pole country over-run 
with home steaders. I think with 
Mx months of night with sleep 
and  re.st I'd get to feeling fine. 
How.somever we have a nice 
bre*»ze this morning and the air 
is all damp-scented with show­
ers here and yon. Eh-en yester- 
day when we came back from 
Oi.ldthwalte we ran into a wet 
place where a sprinkle had fall- 

ànce the going over.
Monday w" went over to Oold- 

thwaite. that is seven of did: 
Mrs Lant Adams. Mrs Herman 
Lee. Mr' Walton Mx>re. Mrs 
Henry Soules and daughter Ina 
Peih . Mrs. L. J Teague, and your 
senbe. to attend the mass meet­
ing o f the women of the county 
to  discuss the organization of 
Hfwie Dcmnstratlon Clubs In the 
CQ«nty. Some sesenty or seven- 
»T-llve women were assembled, 
w uh  County Agent Weaver and 
tlie Home Demonstration Agent. 
Mi - Margaret Scott, in charge 
Wc are all very enthusiastic 
•biHit the work and most es- ry. 
etrntnunltv in *hc i Munty wa"-1 
re-prrsented it the minting W» 
left with the Goldthwalte wo- 
B»ec in process of organization 
ar-* dates =ft for the organlza- 
ti e  and date.s set for the or- 
ga.' :zuuon i: the different enm- 
■ iw .m f-

htrs. John Shelton has return­
ee -i. her ho"’  In Blast Texas 
af.'t-r a visit with her mother.

I with relatives near Weatherford 
Grandmother Garrett has re­

turned home after an extended 
visit with relatives in West Texas 
and N. M She came home for

I Mr and Mrs A L. Padgett and 
d?lighter. Bronda called cn the 
Fn d Nowells Saturday night 

Arnold Sloan and wife and 
daughter. Nelda. spent Friday at 
McMillan with Mr and Mrs 
Wi liam Moates.

The Rufus Mitchell family 
called on the L"e Long family, 
all from Big Valley.

A'l the cattle owners have 
vaccinated tn-«t anthrax, a l - j l  
though no one In this com m unl-' * 
ty has last a cow yet 

Mr and Mrs R T Padgett. 
Mr' A I Sheppard and daugh-

the cpenlng of .school which shelter Jessie went to the Colorado. 
has never mls.,ed I surely thinki g^^a countv Sun-'
It is wonderful for the older folk day
to take .such interest In the work, McConal and wife were In
and plans of the younger - v , . . , . , ^ 
ren Grandmother Is .e „ c d
quite a bit for the Interest she t^e W M
always takes in the first day of ^j^conal home Sunday after-
school

Tom Woolsey and family, of noon were' Mr and Mrs Chas. 
,, ,,  ̂  ̂ Smith. William Benningfleld.

Merle McConal. and Mr and Mrs 
' Ben McConal.

heme^ Sam Drew and
son Larry spent Sunday In Big 
Valley In the Don McConal

relatives
W D Miller died at the

of Carl Teague Monday after a T  
long and serious Illness. He was ^

the Hurstburled Tuesday at 
Ranch Cemetery.

A little daughter has arrived 
at the home of Mr and Mrs 
Fred Wall

Roy Wall, who was taken to 
Temple last week. Is home and 
doing fairly well

Mrs Fred Langford has been 
quite sick the pxst week and at 
this writing is still epafined to 
her bed -— -, o—------
P. T. A. Meeting

The Goldthwalte Parent and 
Teacher's Association will hold 
the first meeting Wedne.sday. 
September 14. In the grammar 
•school auditcrium at four o'clock 

An Invitation Is extended to 
both parents and patrons to be 
present at this meeting -Re-

T  E Hamilton. She was porter

home.
Miss June Knowles will re­

sume her studies at C I. A at 
rX'nton. Monday.

Mrs. Ada Nowell spent Sunday 
In the Fred Nowell home.

Mrs A L Sheppard called In 
the W M. McConal home Mon­
day

Houston Kuykendall spent 
last week In the Casey Smith 
home.

Quite a number from here at­
tended trades day at Oold- 
thwalte. Monday.

Jessie Sheppard spient Sunday \ 
night in the Mitchell home In 
Big Valley.

Mrs A I Sheppard called In 
the Forrest Ross home Wednes­
day.

The R. T Padgett family call­
ed on the A T. Padgett’s late 
Sunday.

mzm m f
I

CLASSIFIED AD RATES
One and one half cents per 

word for first insertion with î 5<. 
minimum. One cent per word 
each suboequent insertion.

Notice« of church entertain, 
merits where a charge of admis­
sion is made, obituaries, cards of 
thanks, resolutions of , respect, 
and all matter not news, will be 
charged for at the regular rates.

For Sale
FOR SALE—Ferguson, rustproof, 
seed oats, 40c bushel. Fred Wit­
tenburg. Scallom. 9-1- 3tp

FOR S A L E - F e r g u s o n  seed 
wheat, 85c per bushel. A A. 
Reynolds. Mulltn, Texas. 9-9-3tp

FOR SALE OR TRADE One 
Deerlng Mower, one Crown Mow­
er. one Drill, also C. O. Norton, 
Route 1. 9-2-2tc

) M e lb j

SAT
I ‘■̂■0 t Hase ̂
I •'«« Pennw-i

I satvrdse,
I TEXJ
! Randolph Scott-;,

|s.'T MIDMoht,
“HAWAIIax ,
‘=mith Balict-e

H ard  to  Fit?
There’s N othing to  it

FOR SALE—Good young regl.s- 
tered Hereford Bulls, and a few 
cows and heifers. E. T. Perkln- 
son, Brosvnwood, Texas. 9-9-3tc

Tl 'S WEDH
“SWISS 1 

^urel laj i

’■'R’ RsdaJ 
“■' he RA(;e oe 
Danielle Dime,. 

P̂ irbath,]

COMING . . ,
■ the ÏEX J 

10. 11 J
the spawn or I

Sept 24 2¿ ]

Farmers and Ranchers
SUPPLY HOUSE

S ugar 44c
SOAP P. & G. 

6 bars 19c
PEAS No. X sixe 

2 cans for 9 C
Toilet Tissue 8  rolls for 25c
JELLO

Package 5c Table Syrup, Vz gal*
A. B. GOLDEN _____________ 29 c

S O O À  Regu lar 10c size 2  boxes For 2 3 C

F lo u r « $1.39
/ /

A s  G o o d  as M o n e y  can B uy

2 C«*rn Flakes
/ /

1 Bran Flakes all for 2lc
M ACARONI OR SPAGHETTI, regular 5c box ______ 3c

Vienna Sausage 2 cans for 13c
SHORTENING Sure Crust 

4-lb. carton 37C
WJBBT’S b r a n d -
p i n e a p p l e  JUICE, regular 10c size, 2 for „  17c

B O L O G N A  lb. 9 c
WB RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANITTIBS

Trade With The Price-Makers O f Goldthwaite

C LYD E  TA TE , Mgr. Prices G ood - Sept. 9— 10

I

Luts of men runie in to see us and say, “ I’m hard to fit — 
because I’m .so tall (or short or stout or thin, aa the case 
may be!).” CrnrriUl.v, before they leave, we’ve taken a load 
t f  worry off Ihrir minds — becaase they’ve learned they can 
conic to us any time and find a Curiee Suit that really fits 
— at a price that is regular.
IVhrther or not that's your problem, you're going to want to 
see cur new srlrction of Curiee Suits for Fall and Winter. 
They’re the last word in the sea.son’s smartest styles and 
newest materials — as outsUinding a value as we’ve ever 
offered. Morr.'ier, they're tailored for ea.sy, comfortable 
fit and long. aalLsfurtory wear by a house with over a quar­
ter century of exprrience in anticipating the clothing re­
quirements of .Amrriran men.
We're featuring Curiee Suits for Fall and Winter in a com­
plete range of styles and models — in sixes to fit you —  at 
prices that arr right! Come in and look them over.

FOR SALE—Registered Angora 
Billies o f heavy shearing, oily 
type Priced right. See W. H 
Laughlln, Moline Rt. 8-26-Stp

Hare your v)w.|,
ed at Spartmia'i

^west sid, ^  
thw xile, TfM x

Yarborough's
Goldthwaite, Texas

Scout Saves Sonora Votes Gymn
Life of Sister And School Building

Max Touchon. Jr., member of Improvetncnt Bonds
Troop Number 36. San Saba, ar­
rived home from a fishing trip 
on the Colorado .several minutes 
after the seemingly lifeless body 
of his little sister. Mary Touchon. 
had been found floating on the 
water of a creek near their home. 
Parents and friends at the scene 
at that time had been unable to 

' resussltate the child. In his 
Scout work Max had learned to 
administer artificial respiration, 
and within a short time was able 
to bring the child back to life by 
this method.

------  0------------

Voters of the Sonora Indepen­
dent School District approved, 
by a vote o f 116 to 29, the Issu­
ance of $32.000 bonds for a gym­
nasium, a four-room school 
building, and repairs to school 
buildings. To supplement the 
Issue, application has been made 
for a $26,000 PWA grant. 

------------ o------------

Good used cars to trade for all 
kinds of livestock. You can see 
them at Pox Sendee Station, 
east side of square.—Key John­
son.

Miscellaneous
FOR RENT—A furnished apart­
ment or sleeping room. Mrs J 
C Mullan, Phone 128 9-2-2tc

POR RENT-Wt 
John.':n ELECTRIC , 
Uher for rent «  $iL 
We carry a comp;-J
John.Mn’j Produrti
mum prices. Hudiai

WANTED—Farm to | 
opti.in to buy al»gt 1 
cuItlTation. 200 scivi 
plenty water. hOMti 
Mm . CTaude T¡-. 
R"'k. Tex Rout« L

I will be at Steen A Son« 
Hardware .Store September 14 It 
IS, with a load of good Singer 
.Machines. Phone me there for 
repaiiw on all sewing machines. 
L  C. Pitts. »-»-Itp

STRAYED  ̂ Two 
Owner please get ia I 
C. Locitiear

I THRESHING 
I thresh Thursday, Sc

STOP THAT ITTHING 
If bothered by the itching of 

Athlete’s Foot, Eczema, Itch, 
Ringworm or sore aching feet 
Hudson Bros, will sell you a Jar 
of Black Hawk Ointment on a 
guarantee. Price 50c and $100 

e-24-lOtc.

at Sam Porter’a in 'Jtl 
and at Chas Hailtvf 
ley place In the a.“«  
Arrowood

Please let me have your pipe, 
windmill and plumbing trouble.«. 
Sharpening lawn mowers and 
what have you. 9 yrt. with Fair- 
man Co. Call me at Fox Service 
Station.— Cecil H. Denson.

8-12-tfc

$15,000 in Csihaoil 
go to Watkins Vanllsa 
It’s simple and caq I 
share of this money, 
my call, or see me i 
Edward Kemp. Ooidth

Texa» to Get Tw o 
Hospitals for Vets

Scout Rally
j A rally for Scouts of six coun- 
: ties of the Comanche Trail Coun- 
I cll was held at Lake Eanes, Co­
manche, Friday evening, O ie  

, hundred and fifty Scouts and 
I Scouters attended from the fol- 
' lowing town.s: Dublin, Coman­
che, Gorman, Rising Star, Brown 
wood, MuIIln. Zephyr, and San 
Saba. Most of the Scouts arrlv- 

' cd In time to swim awhile before 
' the Barbecue supper was served.
! Ths final results of the rally 
were: Mullln. first place; Zephyr.

1 second place, and Comanche, 
Sau Saba, and Rising Star tied 
for third place. The Boy Scout 

, Drum and Bugle Corps from 
I Dublin was present. After the 
rally. Scout Commissioner of the \ 

I Council, Rev. R K. McCa’ l of 
San Saba and Comanche District 

; Chairman J. R. Eanes brought 
'.short messages on Scouting to 
jthe group present 
I ---------- o -------------

Washington.—Two new veter­
ans administration hospitals. In­
stead of the one originally plan­
ned. will be built In Texas. One 
will be located at Dallas and the 
other at Amarillo.

The ho.spitallzatlon board of 
the veterans administration re­
commended the two new hospi­
tals to the president nearly three 
weeks ago and the president ac­
cepted the recommendations 
Tuesday.

------------ o ------------

Gag the Roosters
SALEM, Va.—It’s against the 

law for roosters to crow at night 
here.

.The City Council, annoyed by 
a particularly rauclous-voiced
fowl, outlawed such crowing as 
a public nuisance. Owners of 
Lawbreaklng roosters are subject 
to a $25 fine and 10 days In Jail. 

------------ o----------- -

MAN WANTED to supply Raw- 
lelgh’i  Household Products to 
consumers. We train and help 
you. Good profits for hustlers. 
No experience nacessary. Plear 
sant, profitable, dignified work 
Write Rawlelgh’s, Dept TXI-297- 
53H. Memphl\ Tenn. or see Jess 
Hunt, Comanche, Texas. 9-9-4tp

STOCKMEN-Jlf' 
killer, kills von ui | 
flies. Ouarsnt4«4 ’Jk Í 
ever used or yow i 
Palrman Company

FRIDAY & SATURDAY, Sept 9i

MARRIAGE LICENSE

Marriage license Issued by L. 
B Porter;

L. V. Benningfleld and Earline 
Faulkner.

------------o ----------- -

Speed in His Blood

INTERMEDIATE LEAGUE

Hymn— Would Be There.” 
Prayer.
Leader—Olynn C(dler. 
Scripture—Harriet Allen. 
Introduction—The leader. 
First talk—Pat Chandler. 
Second talk—Coke Long. 
Third talk—Magdalene Long.

Cleveland.-Roger Don Rae, of 
Los Angeles, the airline pilot 
who swore a year ago he had 
quit air racing and lU hazards, 
streaked around a pylon-mark­
ed course at 251.748 miles an 
hour today while his tiny ship 
almost wrested Itself from his 
control.

The flight, In a Folkert plane, 
was only for the purpoee of 
qualifying It for the 125,000 Greve 
event and the $45.000 Thomp­
son Trophy race, the two Ug 
money closed course cards of the 
National Air Races, next Sunday 
and Monday.

P.&G.
LAUNDRY SOAP 
7 giant bars _ 25c

OXYDOl
Large size 
Med. size pW’

'.nvK

L  sr*
tWlr

Dm . Colrin t  filikl 
I pathir. rhirepnetit a il 
cal treatmenta. H«inl| 
1 to 5. Office cm Tm 
Goldthwaite, Texa. .„I 

o
Au.stralla luu J 

per square mile.

If You Can’t Come to Our Store, Our Store wHlOauti 
GRAPES, Thompson white soedleo«. t  lb«.
PIJCNTY OF FRESH BLACK EYED PEAS to sheOai  ̂
SPUDS, home-grown, nice It smooth, 1# lbs. 
LEMONS, large Mie, fnH o ’ Juice (not little kiwte) ^  
GREEN BEANS. ENGLISH PEAS. Ml’ST.lRD '  
TURNIPS It TOPS. CABBAGE. Rl'TlB.lG.l ' 
BEETS, CARROTS. CUCUMBERS. GKEEN ONION’S.' 
LIFLOWER, EGG PLANTS, CELEKY.
TOES, SWEET AND HOT PEPPERS. OKK.L 
RHUBARB—al) priced right.
BANANAS—not too ripe, large fruit, doi.
VANILLA WAFERS, full lb. package 
MARSHMALLOWS, reg. 18c size. 2 pkg.
CRUSHED PINEAPPLE, reg. lOr sUe -1 cans 
SODA, Arm & Hammer, reg. 16c sixe, 2 pkf. 
PIMENTOES, reguUr 19c «lie, 2 caas

I
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MACARONI or SPAGHETTI, 3 boxes
CATSUP, 14 oz b o tt le _____________
BEANS, Chile beans. Mexican style. 2 tall cans ^  
CAKE FLOUR, regular 35c package for -
COCOA, large t  lb. s iz e ____________- —
COFFEE, Folgers, 2 Iba. drip or raguUr -
SYRUP, Pure Ribbon Cane, g a l .------------------
TOILET SOAP, Crystal WhMe (your cheic* «

odors, 4 bars, ------- ------------------------------ - - " " ¿ ^ 3
FLOUR. Light Crust (the cheupeet consWMW 

48 pounds ______________________

LEST YE FORGET. WE SAT IT YET
VEAL STEAK, l b . ....................................
ROAST CHUCK, lb. _________________
BOLOGNA, large or small, S Ibe .------
CHEESE, full Cream, H . _____

BRIM ___  , ^
Home Owned and Home


