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The Epworth Leagve Union, 
composed of the leagues from 
Lampasas, San Saba, Lometa, 
and Ooldthwatte met at the 
Methodist Church here last Fri­
day night.

The attendance was very good. 
About slxty-flve members of the 
various leagues and their res­
pective sponsors and pastors a t­
tended.

Lawrence Stokes, president of 
the Union presided and extend­
ed a cordial welcome to the visit­
ors from the Ooldthwalte league 
A business session followed in 
which the Union which has been 
recently organized discussed the 
selection of a name and a theme 
song for itself. The Kingdom 
Builders was chosen as their 
name and "Are Ye Able" as the 
song. A roundtable discussion 
followed as to what type of or­
ganization the Union should fol­
low. It was decided to test for 
one month the committee form 
and bring up the question again 
at the next meeting for final 
consideration.

Each league was responsible 
for some part of the entertain­
ment at the program. Miss Net­
tie Ruth Brucks of Ooldthwalte 
gave two delightful readings and 
Pat Chandler and Sam Saylor 
played a trumpet duet accom­
panied by Mrs. Saylor. The
I, ampasas league chose Mls.s 
Betty Sue May to represent them 
She gave as a solo, "When Irish 
Eyes are Smiling." The Lometa 
league rendered a violin duet, 
and Miss Betsy Walters of San 
Saba sang several Negro spiritu­
als.

A social hour led by Rev. Fred
J. Brucks was enjoyed In the 
basement of the Churoh, after 
which refreshments were served. 
The visiting leagues gave a ris­
ing vote of thanks to Oold­
thwalte for their hospitality on 
this occasion.

The next meeting of the King­
dom Builder’s will be held at 
Lampasas during the last week 
of July, the date to be decided on 
later.

Paving Starts 
On Lom eta H ighw ay

The barricades will go up 
again on highway 74-A three 
miles south of Ooldthwalte to­
day (Friday) as surfacing of the 
road begins. Brown & Root have 
the contract for the work which 
will consist of a light coat of as­
phalt to preserve the surface 
until regular paving can be se­
cured. This firm recently paved 
the stretch between Lometa and 
the Mills County line, so In a 
short time the road between 
Lometa and Ooldthwalte will be 
hard surfaced all the way. The 
new work will require about 
three weeks,

---------- o----------

Store Surplus F eed  
In Silos

H oliday July Fourth
Monday, July 4. will be observ­

ed as usual this year In Oold­
thwalte by the closing of the 
business houses. The day fol­
lowing, ’Tuesday, July S, has been 
designated as Trades Day.

E agle Straw  Vote  
Show f McCraw  
A head

SUage should be considered a 
substitute for green pasture. It 
has about the same value In the 
ration of a dairy cow or beef 
animal as does green pasture, 

but no greater value unless 
there Is some grain on the feed 
stuff made Into silage.

.A silo makes It possible to 
have green feed when It Is too 
dry or too cold to have a green 
pasture, or too wet to use the 
pasture. A silo should be con- 
■sldered a container In which to 
store a surplus of feed to use 
when the drought year comes.

Orowing feed for sale ot 
present prices Is not an attrac­
tive proposition. It can be pro­
fitably fed to livestock; If turned 
Into silage It will be more profi­
table.

---------- o----------

D ebate O utline  
R eady from  T exas U.

About the only conclusion that 
can be gained from The Eagle’s 
recent straw ballot on candi­
dates for governor Is that most 
of those who sent In coupons 
clipped from The Eagle believe 
Attorney General William Mc­
Craw will lead In the first pri­
mary.

First ballots received some 3 
weeks ago showed McCraw and 
’Thompson close together with 
Hunter third. Later ballots 
show O’Daniel pushing well to 
the front next to McCraw.

A similar poll conducted on 
June 21 by the Wharton Spec­
tator among the editors of 167 
dally and weekly new.spapers re­
sulted as follows: McCraw far In 
the lead; Ernest O Thompson, 
second; Tom Hunter, third; and 
Lee O’Daniel, fourth 

’The Eagle’s ballots have been 
counted and averiged, and give 
the following reault^:

McCraw 655 
O’Daniel 453 
Thomp-son 365 
Hunter 300 
Crowley 80 
Ferguson 41 
King 33 
F’armer 29 
Brogdon 20 
Miller 7

Grading Begun On 
B ridge Job M onday

state Engineer D. L. Hogan 
.said that clearing, grubbing and 
the dirt work on the Colorado 
River Bridge began Monday. 
Work on the bridge proper has 
not been started but equipment 
Is being moved In preparation 
to begin. He stated that the 
grading would require about 60 
days, but the crew would be kept 
on the bridge-building for near­
ly a year

According to Superintendent 
Hanson about 100 men will be 
employed on the Job and more 
than half of the.se will be select­
ed from Ooldthwalte and San 
Saba residents. Headquarters 
for the Job have been set up at 
the sit of the bridge. Material 
to be used on the San Saba side 
will come through San Saba and 
the remainder will come through 
Ooldthwalte.

M E. Ruby, who helped build 
highway 74-a from Ooldthwatte 
to the Lampasas County line, ha.s 
the sub-contract for moving the 
dirt in building the huge em­
bankment on the Mills County 
side of the river. His four huge 
7-yard trucks attracted consider­
able attention In Ooldthwalte 
Wedne.sday when they came In 
for servicing by Falrman Co., 

------------o-----------

Merchants to Feature 
Attractive Prices
C andidates For Gov. 
M et in G oldthw aite

Karl Crowley and W. Lee 
O’Daniel, both candidates for 
governor, met and shook hands 
on the courthouse square In 
Ooldthwalte ’Tuesday. O’Daniel 
disappointed some of his adher­
ents nere by not making a 
speech. His Hill Billy Band

Since next Monday is July 4th, 
and the holiday will be observed 
In Ooldthwalte, the next day, 
Tuesday, has been set for Gold- 
thwalte’s July Trades Day. 
Another free picture show and 
other attractions are being pre­
pared for the entertainment of 
shoppers.

Ernest O. Thompson, candi­
date for Oovernor, will speak at 
4:00 o’clock In behalf of his can­
didacy to the Trades Day crowd. 

---------- o----------passed up the town In their hur-
7 «  ""‘’ ¡M ethodi.1 Q uarterly

Mr. Crowley spoke for more | C onference M et at 
than an hour, paying particular 
attention to hts plan for liber­
alizing the old age pensions In 
Texas and his fight against 
monopolies.

---------- o----------

‘Arm y o f South’ 
To See A ction

First Baptist Church
E. E. DAWSON, Pastor

lusnlta Wright 
Cunningham 

'■'iiam dlrec- 
I meeting. The 

to adjourn, 
®tlng which 
Friday night

i '̂Jfnirnid. the 
U'iness meet- 
club quilt 
planned our

Bly J8.
our quilt 
We are all 

tlrese events.

Next S u n d a y  begins the 
church’s annual revival. It will 
continue ten days or two weeks, 
as conditions may determine. 
There will be two services a day 
for everybody, and some group 
meetings also held dally. Ira 
Powell of Borger, Texas, will di­
rect the music. ’The evening ser­
vices will be held on the lawn. 
The morning services on week 
days will be at 10:00 o’clock, the 
evening at 8:15. All members of 
the church are urged to get Into 
the meeting at the very begin­
ning, and a cordial invitation Is 
given to all the people of the 
community to attend as they can 
and are Inclined.

Next Sunday morning at 11:00 
the Lord’s Supper will be cele­
brated. In like manner, at that 
hour a semiannual catch-up will 
be presented. It Is hoped that a 
representative group will be 
present.

Preliminary out'lne of avail­
able material on the sales tax 
question has been prepared .by 
the University of Texas Inter­
scholastic League and Is avail­
able free of charge for high 
school students who wish to do 
some summer reading on the 
question that will be debated In 
the League debates during the 
1938-39 school year.

"Many ambitious students 
wish to do summer reading on 
the League debate question so 
that they may enter the study 
of the que.stlon In the fall with 
a richer background.” Roy Bedl- 
chek. director of the League, ex­
plained. "The regular debate 
handbook of 250 pages will not 
be ready for distribution before 
schools open In the fall. In the 
meantime, the bibliography will 
furnish the student an Intelli­
gent guide for summer reading. 
The bibliography Is sent free on 
request addressed to the Inter- 
.'cholastlc League, Austin, Tex­
as."

Self 6 
McCoy 6 
Renfro 5

Am erican Business^
I Behind the Scenes in

—Bv John Tracidock-

M ethodist Church

May we urge all who attend 
our church to be pre.sent for the 
Church School session next 

■ Sunday. Remember the contest 
I between the ladies and girls and 
I the men and boys begins next 
Sunday. Don't miss the first 
Sunday.

There will be no preaching ser­
vices either Sunday morning 
or Sunday night. We hope you 
will visit with our sister churhes. 
The meeting here at Bethel is 
starting fine. Pray for us.

FRED J. BRUCKS, Pastor

F H A  C onference

F. D. Sykes, from the Federal 
Housing office at F1)rt Worth, 
was here this week for a confer­
ence with lumber dealers, con­
tractors and business men on the 
Federal Housing Administration 
building requirements.

A considerable Increase in 
building In Mills County under 
the FHA provisions Is expected 
this year.

Blue Bonnet Club
Our last meeting was at Mrs. 

Walter Simpson’s on June 21. 
TThe afternoon was spent in help­
ing our hostess can potatoes.

A delicious plate consisting of 
sandwiches, pickles, potato 
chips and cookies with delicious 
Iced lemonade was served to six 
club members and Mrs. Oscar 
Burns and daughter, Mrs Emily 
Blackburn, Mrs. Harry Palmer 
and Mrs. Willis Kill as guesU.

We adjourned to meet with 
Mrs. M. L. Casbeer July 6.

NEW YORK, June 30—BUSI­
NESS The dollars and cents fu­
ture for buslne.ss men, mer­
chants. farmers, and even house­
wives brightened considerably 
last week following a dramatic 
upsurge In stock and bond pric­
es. The rise In security values 
strongly Indicates that business 
recovery will begin by late sum­
mer or early fall, as predicted 
several weeks ago In this column. 
Stock prices usually rise several 
months before Improvement ap­
pears in retail sales, factory 
output and employment. Inves­
tors pour millions of dollars Into 
secuniles over night once their 
confidence In the future Is re- 
s t o r e d .  Simultaneously, of 
course, people the country over 
begin to buy more of the things 
they need to enjoy living- 
homes, autos, clothes, movie 
tlckeU. c o l l e g e  educations, 
pianos, golf clubs and vacations. 
Acquisitions such as these usu­
ally take time, however, whereas 
a man can buy In an hour as 
many stocks and bonds as he has 
money to Invest. That Is one 
reason why a rise In stock prices 
usually precedes by several 
months any real upturn In gen­
eral business.

WASHINGTON—W11 h Con­
gress adjourned until January, 
unless called back for a special 
.session to consider railroad leg­
islation, the nation’s capital 
once more takes on an air of 
quletltude and leisure. Political 
forecasters are reading with In­
terest the current survey In For­
tune magazine analyzing the 
feelings of persons In all walks 
of life toward the New Deal and 
President Roosevelt. The sur­
vey Indicates that the personal 
popularity of the president Is 
undlmlnished, but that a more 
critical attitude Is being taken of 
many New Deal policies and ac­
tivities.

GOOD NEWS FOR FARMER— 
A leading farm Implement 
manufacturer has announced

WAPINGTON-The War De­
partment announced today that 
66.523 officers and men would 
take part In war games of the 
TTiird Army In the South and 
Southwest In August.

It will be "the large.st assem­
bly of troops In a single related 
maneuver that has ever taken 
place In our peace-time history," 
the War Department said.

One of the four main divisions 
of the country's military organi­
zation, the Third Army Includes 
regular Army and National 
Guard units In the Fourth and 
Eighth Corps Areas and Is In ef­
fect the Army of the South.

Troops will be concentrated at

Baptist V acation  
School C losed Friday

A highly , succe.ssful \-acatlqn 
.school closed Friday when the 
local BaptJst Church ended Its 
first vacation school. During the 
two weeks’ work there were 107 
children registered and enrolled. 
The largest attendance In any

San Saba
A Quarterly Conference of a 

g r o u p  of four of the 
Methodist Churches met Sunday 
afternoon. June 26, at San Saba. 
Presiding Elder J B Horton was 
In charge of the group which In­
cluded pastors and laymen from 
San Saba. Ooldthwalte, Lometa 
and Richland Springs.

The business on hand was dis­
charged, and favorable report* 
were turned In by the mlnlstera. 
Rev. Horton praised the newly- 
organized Elpworth League Union 
on Its splendid start. TMbutk 
was paid to the memory of Mra.one day was 85. Two conver-, 

sions were made during the peri- i W. H. Kimbrough, recently de­
ed. A faculty of twenty persons 
Interested In the work conducted 
lessons, games and handiwork.

A picnic attended by the pa­
rents of the children registered

ceased, of San Saba by Rev. Geo.
J. Stelnman.

Ooldthwalte was well-repre­
sented at the conference with 
Rev. Fred J Brucks and over 20

in the school was given Friday i tti^"ihers of the local church at- 
at 6:00 p. m. Following this there j 
were commencement exercises at
8:00 at which the children pre-1 Santa Fc Increases
sented a program showing the ,
work they had accomplished In | W orking U ays
the school. j q ^ lVESTON Proposal to In-

The program included songs, i f ease the number of work days 
salutes to the Bible and to th e |^ j mechanical employees of the
Christian and American Flags. 
The primary children put on a

Santa Fe System Lines was an­
nounced today by W. K. Etter,

several points. The main con- j ney across the Red Sea. The
pantomime depicting Moses Jour- president in charge of op-

centratlon, comprising troops of 
the Fourth Corps Area, will be In 
the De Soto National Forest. Mis 
slsslppi, July 31 to Aug 14. and 
will Involve 26.499 officers and 
men.

Tl'oops from the Eighth Corps 
Area will be concentrated at sev­
eral points, chiefly In the Camp 
Bullís area near San Antonio, 
where 26.208 officers and men 
will be ma.ssed Aug, 6-20 

---------- o ........ -

San Antonio Church

Juniors, with Louis Hudson and 
Alvls Buford as preachers, ex­
plained the purpose of a vaca­
tion school. The Intermediates 
put on a play stressing tithing 
and its impKjrtance. An exhibit 
of the handwork done during the 
school showed coloring, shellac 
work, posters, woodwork, and 
sewing. The Intermediate girls 
made cup towels, aprons, and 
pillow slips for the church and 
hospitals.

An interesting sidelight of the 
school was the work done by Mrs.

N am e. Supply P . .t o r  LT.
The Rev. Joseph Owens, Union 

SprIngs,*Ala„ was named by the 
board of stewards of Travis Park 
Methodist Church Tuesday as 
supply pastor for the church un­
til a succe.ssor to the Rev. J. 
Grady Timmons, who died Sun­
day, can be selected.

Funeral services for Dr. Tim­
mons, held Tuesday morning at 
Travis Park Church, were at­
tended by more than 1,000 per­
sons, delegations attending from 
all of Dr. Tlmmon’s former Tex­
as pastorates, San Ange l o ,  
Brownsville, McAllen and Lam­
pasas as well as friends from 
Corpus Chrlstl, San Benito and 
other South Texas towns.

Y . W . A .

songs to cheer them. Each day 
the students of the school 
brought flowers, which were pre­
sented to someone sick or In 
need of cheering.

As evidence that the children 
enjoyed It, one little chap was 
overheard to announce that he 
wished the vacation Bible school 
would last six months.

Rev. E. E. Dawson, superinten­
dent of the school, the faculty 
and parents are enthusiastic over 
work done and plan to have 
another vacation Bible school 
next year.

---------- 0----------

eratlons.
Effective July 1. employees of 

the mechanical department, in­
cluding all shop forces having 
been on a three-day week since 
May 1. are to be placed on a five- 
day week.

The Increase will benefit ap­
proximately 8.000 employees 
over the entire system. More 
than 1.000 Texas employees of 
the Santa Fe are involved In the 
Increase.

Lucky Editor
The Eagle Editor appreciates 

the thoughtfulness of her friends 
this week. Mrs E. H. Hapgood 
presented her with a heaping 
basket of beautiful vegetable«, 
samples of the produce of their 
fertile Big Valley farm. Mrs E. 
L. Pass remembered the editor 
with some delicious fish, the 
finest we have seen In some 
time. With tasty cornbread bak­
ed from freshly ground corn- 
meal from Edward’s mUl, the 
editors family has fared ext-a 
well this week.

(CONTINUED ON PAGE 5)

The Y, W. A. will meet In the 
home of Mrs. L. A. Moon Tuesday 
afternoon at 4:00 o’clock for a 
Bible Study which will be the 
ninth and tenth chapters of 
Matthew.

The home of Ruth Goosby was 
opened to the Y ,W. A. Tuesday 
evening, with a business pro­
gram.

A wxtlal was planned which 
will be a lawn party at Oleta 
Henry’s Saturday night—4tb of 
July Jamboree.—Reporter,

Senator N elson  
T alks in G oldthw aite

with a frank discussion of 
his views on the perplexing 
problems of state government 
and a challenge to his opponents 
to tell where they stand. Senator 
G. H. Nelson of Lubbock Coun­
ty Wednesday morning brought 
his whirlwind campaign for 
Lieutenant Governor to Gold­
thwaite. An aggressive cam­
paigner, Nelson spent three hours 
here greeting voters along the 
streets and in the business hous- 
**. .  - a s
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The
Trent State 

Bank

No business too large  

for us to handle, none 

too sm all to receive

every courtesy and

attention.

G oldthw aite, T exas

Grimes County 
W aterm elons
Watermelons wUI probably be 

produced In excess In Orlmes 
County this year Around Stone- 
ham. Walter Lyles says .some 400 
acres hare been planted, while 
lola. according to H. H. Taylor, 
will as usual produce In excess 
of 100 acres In view of these 
facts It Is only natural that 
those who mature and harvest 
the early crop will reap the 
greatest reward.

P i n k  Harrington, vigorous 
farmer of White Hall, has re­
cently received much favorable 
comment for his Ingenuity In 
forestalling the blighting effect 
of a late spring frost which 
threatened his watermelons early 
In April. The fact remains that 
Mr Harrington saved over half 
of his 35-acre patch through 
covering the young plants with 
hay the evening a withering cold 
west wtnd descended with des­
truction upon the tender melon 
planting. In describing his ef­
forts In this direction, Mr Har­
rington said forty bales of hay 
were used In the twelve acres 
protected, and that It took six 
colored boys and himself about 
four hours tJ do the job or to go 
as far as they did l:«fore night 
set in. Each hill was covered 
with a double handfull of hay

in and around the edges of the 
mulch to keep the straw from 
being bloam off by the wind. 
Everyone will recall that this 
cold wind blew for two days but 
Mr Harrington did not remove 
the hay until the following Mon­
day morning, at which time he 
learned his efforts had been suc­
cessful. The other half of the 
crop not so protected was totally 
destroyed. Before making his 
attempt to save the watermelons, 
a number of neighbors had 
warned him not to do it because 
the plants would only be 
smothered and stunted beyond 
revival —Orlmes County Review. 

---------- o----------
Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Burnett 

spent Sunday at Kerrville with 
their grandchildren. Marvin and 
Bert Weatherby, who are In camp 
at Mystic and Steward Camps. 
They were accompanied by their 
son J. B Burnett and wife. 

----------o---------
Mary Jo Warren returned to 

her home at Rankin Thursday 
after a visit with relatives here 
and at Dublin.

----------o----------
Zachary Taylor, 12th president 

of the United States, died Id 
months after taking office.

---------- o----------
The mining Industry furnishes 

nearly 90 per cent of the exports 
while sufficient soli was pushed!of Chile.
» 1 »  I P .1I _ * 1  ■! I

Properly Equipped 
Shop.

Balanced Parts 
Stock.

Factory Trained 
Mechanics. 

Desiring to give 
Better Service.

Tour car was built to give you satisfactory service, 
le t  us look after it and you will get the service you are 

rightfully entitled to.
Nothing left off that Is needed 

Nothing put on that Is unnecessary.
No job too .small—no job too large for us to handle efficiently

Saylor Chevrolet Co.

(Too lAte for Last Week)
Summer days are wrtth us In 

full sway. Showers fell last week 
 ̂and It Is very sultry. Threshing 

i  of grain Is the main work of the 
' farmers. They seem well pleas- 
I ed with the results except the 
I wheat crop is very light.
I Mr and Mrs. Allen Carter went 
ito Cottonwood last Thursday, 
for a visit with their son, Loy, 
and family Mrs Winnie Price 
and children stayed with MKs 
Hulda and kept everything at 
home O K. Sunday they drove 
over to celebrate Father’s Day 
at Cottonwood and made It a 
pleasant surprise for their fath­
er. He says it was one of tht- 
best days he ever enjoyed.

A number from here attended 
conference at Bethel so there 
wtus no Sunday school at the 
Methodist Church. It was Bro 
Wade's day at the Baptist 

¡Church. He came and preached 
at the morning hour and gave 
in hla resignation. This was a 
grave surprise to many of his 
friends. Bro. Wade has been 
pastor here for some time and 
has many friends, not only with 
his church, but others. We wish 
for him and his family the best 
of success.

Prof Bertram Oeeslln enrtrfl- 
ed at Texas Tech at Lubbock 
He svlll specialise In band music 
and do credit work on his M A 
degree

Mr and Mrs Lyle Oeeslln and 
little son, Donald Linn, of Alvin, 
left last Wednesday for the'.r 
home, after spending ten days 
with his parents, Mr and Mrs 
J. M Oeeslln. They visited his 
sister. Miss Varnell, at Austin on 
their way home

Alvin Reese came on the bus 
Tuesday morning, for a visit svlth 
his great-granddaughter, Mrs 
E. J. Morris. His mother wa.s 
known here as Miss Iva McMil­
lan.

A message received here Tues­
day morning stated W. J. Adams 
had died at hla home In Uvalde. 
Mr. Adams osvned the store here 
and w’as postmaster for many 
years. He Is kindly remembered 
by all the older folks, who join 
In extending sympathy to his 
relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. J M Oeeslln 
visited In the Oglesby home 
Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. J. W. Coffman received a 
message Monday morning stat­
ing her brother had died at 3 
o’clock at his home In Haskell 
County. Her son, Herbert, and 
Miss Gladys and Raymond Cas- 
beer accompanied her there for 
the burial. He had been in ill 
health for a long time and his 
death was not unexpected. Our 
sympathy is with Mrs Coffman 

land family In their hour of be­
reavement.

Mi,s.s Catherine Wright of 
Goldthwaite .spent last week 
with Gilma Wright.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Blackwell, 
Mls-s Clara and Mrs. Aubra Hud­
son and little son spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Tommie Den­
nis at the Palrman Ranch across 
the Bayou. Mrs. Wesley Warren 
of Arkansas and her daughter 
of Oklahoma were there on a 
visit.

Miss Naomi Langford of Mexla 
.spent last week at home help­
ing care for her new niece, the 
baby of Mr. and Mrs. Hollis 
Blackwell.

Hot Summer Sun...
. . . .  is hard on your house, a coat of 

Pittsburgh Paints w ill help preserve it, 

m ake it last m any more years by keeping  

the sun from  cracking the shingles and  

sid in g . S ee  our line of paints and var­

nishes.

J. H. RANDOLPH LUMBER CO.
G old thw aite , TexsM

E

i DRY CLEANING  i
) Pressing and Repairing f 
j of all garments for I 
I Men, Women and Children. | 
j  We have the experience | 
i an(] machinery to do the | 
I i^rk  right. iright.

C. M. BURCH I

RIDE THE BUS
CREAMER STAGE LINE

North Roand—
Lv. Goldthwaite 11:20 a. m.

For Priddy, Comanche. De 
Lecm and Eastland and con­
necting points.

Sonth Bonnd—
I Lv. Goldthwaite 12:40 p. m.

For San Saba. Uano, Fred- 
ericlubiirg and San Antonio 
and connecting points.

stop at Clements Drag 
staro and Snytor BotcL

You are now face to face with 
’•Sklnnle” Klmhng. an ace black 
face comedian, formerly with 
Lasses White Minstrels. ’’Skln- 
nle" Is with the Jimmie Hull’s 
players who will pitch their big 
tent here for a two-nlght stand 
Wednesday and Thursday, July 
6 and 7.

Plesisant Grove
By Ruby D. Berry

Proposal of the Texas Inter- 
scholastic League to organlie 6- 
man football districts Is meeting 
with approval among smaller 
schools of the State, according 
to R J Kidd, athletic director 
of the University of Texas Lea­
gue office.

Demonstrations In fl-man foot­
ball are being given In the sum­
mer physical education courses 
of the following Institutions 
North Texas State Teachers Col­
lege, Stephen f. Austin State 
Teachers College, Texas ’Techno 
logical College, and at the Uni 
verslty of Texas. Kidd said.

"We are confident that at 
least one hundred small high 
schools will experiment with this 
game as a fall sport this year 
Mr Kidd predicted. "It Is hoped 
that the sport will prove worth­
while for schools that do not 
have enough boys to play 11 
man football, and still have a 
sufficient number of boys of the 
football type to make up a six 
man squad. It has the addition­
al advantage of being a relative­
ly Inexpensive sport."

Well, after missing several 
weeks. I wlU try to write a little 
of the latest news.

There were but twenty-eight 
at Sunday school. We are glad to 
have Miss Gladys Ca.sbeer and 
Miss Virginia Boyd visiting with 
us.

It won’t  be long until the 
threshers will be through In this 
community and 1 Imagine every­
one will surely be glad

Quay Irvin from near Mineral 
Wells visited friends In this com­
munity last week end.

Mr. and Mrs Sam Miller went 
to Temple last Tuesday. Mrs 
Miller was not getting along as 
well this time as she was the 
last time she went for treatment

Doris Hereford visited Novaleen 
Berry Saturday evening and No­
valeen returned home with her 
to visit a few days.

Syble Miller and Ruby D Ber­
ry visited De Alva Vlrden TTiurs- 
day evening.

Miss Gladys Casbeer visited 
friends in this community last 
Sunday.

Mrs. Arthur Robbins gave a 
swimming party for the Inter­
mediate Sunday School class and 
their families Friday night Re­
freshments of Ice cream, cake, 
and cookies were served.

Mrs. Weldon Lucas spent Wed­
nesday with Novaleen Berry.

Mis-s Mary Beth Palmore and 
Prof. Raymond Williams attend­
ed the party at Charlie Miller’s 
Saturday night and spent Sat­
urday night with them They 
are both attending school at 
Brownwcod this summer.

Mr. and Mrs. Seaborn Ben- 
nlngfleld and baby visited her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hor­
ton at Cotton Wood, Sunday.

Miss Virginia Boyd of Abilene 
visited De Alva Vlrden last week 
end.

Rosa Lucas of Center City 
visited her brother, Weldon Lu- 
ca.s and wife last week end.

T. J. Duncan, Jr., from Oden 
Is visiting relatives In this com­
munity.

Earlene Pierce, Helen Kerby, 
Jean McCall, Dorothy Crouch, 
Bonnie Crews, and Wilma Joyce 
Bloffet from Lometa attended

Birthday Party
Saturday night, June 25, Miss 

Syble Miller entertained a num 
ber of her friends with a birth­
day party, celebrating her 13th 
birthday, which was June 23, at 
her home in Pleasant Orove.

Many delightful games were 
played throughout the evening 
and were enjoyed by everyone 
present.

At a late hour refreshments of 
punch, cookies, and cake were 
served to about sixty guests.

Everyone had a grand time 
and we wUh Syble many more 
happy birthdays.

InduQii

w ith cotton predictions the 
main topic of conversation in the 
Orlmes agricultural areas. Coun­
ty Agent George A. Altgelt said 
today that the best looking crop 
from a standpoint of maturity, 
tilth, and uniformity Is found 
this early In tne season on the 
farms of Walter Greenwood of 
Plantersvllle.

His trip over the county car­
ried him to Mr, Greenwood’s 
Sand Creek plantation where 
cotton Is blooming and the 
crop Is waist high, being espe­
cially full of forma and flowers 
with fruit visible near the roots, i ... .u,,

Covering approximately 3000 I ***<̂
acres of cropland, the Green-1 
wood farms have 900 of this area countv 
devoted to cotton, C. A. Deese I 
serves as Mt. Greenwood’s right- ^
hand man, County Agent Altgelt 
added.

Effects of much hard work are i 
seen on the place where about

recenu, 
^Isslppl. la I 
carload of ennwj"]

throughout th* „cl
applied to thi
“Hi »nd F*brM„3 
from 150toMo7** 

Altgelt
The tenant fu 

larly were 
'Pent with tlu'i 
terresulU. OntkC 
Greenwood iiKdj 
plantings which 0
talned twic«thM 
fertilised check«,
‘leal Of Inter«, 
this part Of the e 
of these expen

and fifty colored families labor 
dally to accomplish their objec­
tives

Syble Miller’s party Saturday 
and spent Saturday night and 
Sunday with Syble Mr. and 
Mrs. Bloffet came after them 
Sunday evening.

Travis Orlffln and family visit­
ed Miss Edith Covington. Sunday

Mr. and Mrs. Red Arrowood. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bert Wright and 
family, and Mr. and Mrs O. Z 
Berry and Ruby D. visited In the 
Dude Wllky home Sunday.

Miss Novaleen Berry spent 
last Tuesday night with Ruby D 
Berry.

Mrs. Tom Miller and children 
from town and Mrs Clark Mil­
ler and Melba Dean spent Fri­
day with Mr.s. Sam Miller.

W. J. Jeffrey and Harvey Jef­
frey visited In the Pecan Wells 
community Sunday evening.

Mrs. Menzle Curb and daugh­
ter from San Saba are visiting 
Mrs. Ray Berry.

Editor 0fitin̂ ,|g 
County snd u , 3 
Greenwood, vhe 1̂  
Ing Interesti thm̂  
over the stiutwenty-five white tenant units 

and flftv colored families lahnr fg^ilng
He Is slio 1 

onch In B(w> i
Following hU observaUons last Kempner ir.twiJ 

fall of the cotton growing con-| Mr De«« «!_ 
ditlons on the Mississippi Delta man U i  tom-JI 
Farms where two bales per acre 
have been common within the' 
past few years, Mr. Greenwood 
concluded that rich Orlmes 
County lands could be made to 
do likewise. j

As a result of this trip, he sub-1 
stituted thick stands In Planters i 
vine for regular practices, and 
five planU were allowed to re- I 
main at the usual hoespace In- j| 
tervals Instead of the customary 
one or two. Mr Altgelt aaid 

A large block of Plneland N > 0 
II cottonseed was made In order 
to thoroughly teat out this new

H 5 I ,

ly  Nourished W om tn ^  
They Just C a n t Hold Up

Are you g e tt in g  proper 
Bourlshnient from your food, 
and restful sleep?

A poorly nourished body 
just can’t  hold up. And as for 
that run-down feeling, that 
nervous fatigue, — don't neg­
lect Itl

Cardul, for lack of appetite, 
poor digestion and nervous 
fatigue, h a s  been  recom­
mended by mothers to daugh­
ters — women to women — for 
over fifty years.

Try Itl Thousands of women 
CesUfy Cardwl helped them. Of 
ooune, If It does not beneflt YOU, 
oeosult a ptaytlelan.

ofihm
RAZOR B
end o2S‘ hiktL
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i BE IT  K N O W N  TO ALL TO Wi

1S9S 1938

J. N. K EESE
Marble and Granite Memorial 

Best 5fatrrials and Work­
manship.

My 45 years study and ex­
perience at your service. 

Prices Low
See me before placing your 

order.

Fi.slier St., Goldthwaite, Texas

TH ESE PR E SE N T S MAY CC

/ /
FRESH  UP / /

With

I

That whereas, the Supreme Court of TeM|l 
immemorial, been composed of lawyen imlwP 
found understanding of the reasons for, u 
pies of. the laws of ’Texas; men with conunoni  ̂
all learned men pre-eminent; men whoMhor«
Is una.ssalled and unlmpeached; and.

Whereas, a Supreme Court composed of 1 
the.se attributes la, by one and all. deemri ( 
general welfare and happiness of Texas and f

Whereas the Honorable Richard Criuofl 
ty, Texas was. on the 30th day of April. 
Supreme Court of Texas to serve the ur.fi] 
late William Pierson, and, as such Associate J 
preme Court has served the State of Texas i 
dlclously, impartially and diligently; and,

Wl'creas, the record of the said Richarf̂  
general practitioner of law and as Associater 
prem* Court of Texas, merits the commend 
as well as lawyers, and as his honesty and W 
and cannot be assailed or Impeached;

TTierefore. we. the undersigned membersof» 
as-Mills County Bar Association, do hereby* 
the Honorable Richard Crltz to all cituM*' 
Texas as a just and learned judge and the T 
nently qualified for the office of AssocUti  ̂
preme Court of Texas.

RESPECTFUUY

Sometimes you feel so hot that • 
you wonder if you ever have been • 
cool and comfortable. That's the  ̂
time to Drink a Bottle of 7-lP. Let i 
7-lJP coo] that hot spot quick. 7-LT  ̂
really quenches thirst. One bottle has | 
the cooling effects of quantities of 
water.

You Like 7-up 

And It Likes You

Roy L. Walker 
J. V. Hammett 
Gordon C. Caas 
J. J. Byrne 
J Fylvester Lesvls 
Porter Briggs 
J. Tom Higgins 
J. C. Abney 
Few Brewster 
Jas K. Evetts 
J. H. Wagner 
Martin M. White

We.-ley Dice 
Edgar W Cale 
Lee Curtis 
8am D. Snodgrass 
O. W. Word 
W. O, Cox 
W R. Brown 
Byrcn Skelton 
Walker Saubbury 
Barnet B Skelton 
J. B. Talley 
Win bourn Pearce

Owen P. Carpenter Jno. J. Daniel
Arthur Holland 
J. W. Thomas 
E C. Zellner 
W. 8. Shipp

Henry Taylor 
W. A. Messer 
DeWItt Bowmer 
Ned Elnor Moore

Thla Adv. paid  fa r  by frie«d» M I
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___ Mrs. Cora Ford

[ i r o n  a n d  w a t c h  s p r i n g s
■ gj. X. C. RICHARDSON, Secretary 

B r e e d e r - Feeder Assoctatioti

j  classic Illustration 
|of skill which tells 
1 of watch spring Is 

thousand times 
|he pig Iro" 

i,,y are made. The
f transformation, 
such spectacular 
urs every day on 
ton of hay Is a 

jorth a few dollars, 
tls far the ride will 
L the hay Feed 
[cow. the butterfat 
I Is worth several 
) as the ton of hay 
) town in a can. 
)̂ushel would be a 

■ barley, but Greer 
It rger County sold 
I barley for $300. It 
Und valuab’e varl- 
ku't ordinary bar- 
I the grain market 
, mewhere around 

It is no mystery 
Mr Creager had 

Ifh had grown up 
I pasture and skim 
i d the barley and 
3 .gs; it sold for 

f pork. Just 
f the bar steel and 
►'.gs.

careless" weeds 
t.nty. Texas, sold 
pn cash in 1919. .\ 

grazed It for 
' with no other 
jeream produced 
Jiiier of the cows 
[better than $3 a 
i.ijrmatlon did 
• weed-grown ten 

paid the owner 
[ten acres he had

)ing
re Muscles
St COSUlM SCtlF«

) Ums IocbI i r t i  ss , 
•«rsM^ b lss4  Is

S t q s k k lf  tostlM 
; BiuKist, tp ra tst, 

IiubK«CS. B«lUr4*t 
id 60c.

BROS.
Dniagist

In cotton, and cotton worth 35 
cents a pound that year. If he 
hadn’t the cows. If the cows had 
not that miraculously alchemy, 
the ten acres would have paid no 
rent, he would have been short 
$300 for three months milking 
chores, and the whole communi­
ty would have been $300 less 
well off a t the end of the year.

These are extreme cases, but 
facts nevertheless. Why sell pig 
Iron when you can make watch 
springs of It? Eggs and milk, 
meat and wool, are but the re­
fined forms of grain and fonge 
Several acres of crops can be 
wrapped In a steer's hide; a good 
cow well fed will produce milk or 
butterfat equal to her own value 
every year, and raise a calf be­
sides; a ewe will raise a lamb 
worth as much on the market] 
as his dam In half a year, and 
pay for the privilege wtlh wool.

Feed crops, whether of grain 
or roughage, are worth no more 
for productive purposes after a 
long ride by truck or train than 
they are on the farm where 
they grew. Clearly then the 
farmer who turns them Into fin­
ished products right on the 
ground has a distinct advantage 
In the economy of production; 
and economy of production Is the 
first -Step toward profitable sale.

It Is never true economy to 
stint the feed of growing animals 
and fowls which are being sold. 
Rather the farmer, thinking In 
terms of selling his feed to the 
best advantage, tries to get as 
much of It as possible Into meat 
or milk or eggs. It is also some­
times good economy to buy what­
ever Is necessary to make up a 
good balanced ration if the farm 
does not supply It. In other 
words corn alone will fatten a 
hog. but with a protein supple­
ment It will ¿ 0  farther and fa t­
ten better.

Young fowls and animats make 
moat rapid gains In weight, and 
weight is primarily what we sell, 
but the young need more highly 
concentrated feeds than the old.

i

We are having some warm, dry 
weather now.

Bro. Pertlller filled his regular 
appointment Saturday night. The 
date for the revival was set for 
Saturday night before the third 
Sunday In July.

Allen Carter and daughter and 
Mr. Piper from Center City at­
tended the services Sunday 
night.

Earl Blake and wife spent the 
week end In Mrs. Ora Black’s 
home.

Dr. Walter Ford and a friend 
and Miss Cannady of Austin, 
brought Rachel Ford home and 
spent several days with his 
mother before returning to his 
duties at Galveston

Mrs. T. J. Laughlln came home 
Sunday evening after sp)ending 
two weeks with her son, Webb.

Mrs. Mamie Wilson of Big 
Springs Is visiting with her 
friend, Mrs. D. Jones and other 
friends. This Is her first trip 
here In over 30 years.

Mr. and Mrs Floyd Bearden 
visited with their friends, Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Laughlln and at­
tended church Saturday night.

Garland Crawford spent one 
day last week In Mrs R D Evans 
home. He reported his mother 
improving.

Mrs. Cora Ford spent Sunday 
afternoon with Mmes. D. Jones 
and Mamie Wilson.

Mrs. Jones is Improving and 
can be about In the house again.

David Jones'and wife are stay­
ing with his mother.

Several from here attended 
the ball game between Lometa 
and Bend played at Lometa 
Sunday. i

There were 18 present at thel 
Good Will Club at Mrs. Homer 
Eckerts Thursday. Mrs. Eckert I 
served lemonade and cake. The 
next meeting will be with Mrs. 
Cora Ford. July 7 The club 
agreed to meet with Mrs. Ora 
Black Wednesday and help her 
quilt.

Velma Gage and family at­
tended church Sunday at Lome­
ta.

The Harris boys are doing some 
baling for Dutch Smith and 
John Kuykendall.

Ed Evans and family spent the 
week end with Mrs. Evans, pa­
rents. Mr. and Mrs. Bradbury, 
near the Bend.

John Harris and wife and some 
of their grandchildren spent 
Sunday In Dutch Smith’s home.

Mrs, Cora Ford received a 
message Saturday, stating that 
her brother. Tom Fleming, of 
Alamagorda, New Mexico, had 
been stricken with paralysis and 
was In a very serious condition.

It is not true economy to try to 
make baby beef with hay or fit 
turkeys for market without 
grain. Both weight and quality 
decide the price, and both must 
be kept In mind, especially In the 
latter part of the finishing peri­
od, The rule among successful 
feeders Ls to "keep ’em growing 
fast when young and crowd ’em 
with everything they need and 
will take before you go to town 
with ’em."

Speaks H ere

R. A. (BOB) STUART
CKndi«iat€ foe RoilroaJ CommlMios

Stuart Promises 
A id to Business

Professional politicians and 
chronic office-holders were de­
nounced by Robert A. (Bobi 
Stuart of Fort Worth In an ad­
dress here Tuesday In Interest of 
his candidacy for railroad com­
missioner. He said that Texas 
cannot expect prosperous times 
to return until some of the "Ins" 
are put out at Austin and some 
of the "outs" are put In.

Stuart said he sought the of­
fice of railroad commissioner 
upon the rectwd he has made as 
state senator, Tarrant County 
district attorney, president of the 
board of regents of the seven 
Texas State Teachers Colleges 
and as holder of three major 
Federal Housing Administration 
positions to which he was ap­
pointed by President Roosevelt.

Stuart prcMnlsed to stand for 
lower freight and gas rates, re­
lief for the Independent truck­
ers who "are being driven off the 
highways,’’ oil proratlon that 
will let Texas compete with other 
states and regulations that will 
bring a revival of Industrial ac­
tivity in the state.

---------- o----------
If you have visitors, a party, 

or social gathering tell the Eagle 
about It.

---------- o----------
Say you saw it in The Eagle!

Star
By Nn. Dorm Good*

Mr. and Mrs. Autrey Teague 
and their mother, Mrs. Festus 
Teague, of Brownwood, visited 
relatives Thursday of last week.

Mrs. Florence Teague, who has 
been visiting relatives In north­
ern Texas the past month has 
returned home.

Little Miss Connie Lee May- 
field Is spending a few weeks 
with relatives In Brownwood.

James Witty, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J. J. Witty, has returned to 
his post In San Antonio, after a 
six week’s furlough with home 
folks.

Mrs. Fredda Marshall and little 
son are visiting her mother, Mrs. 
Lonnie Baker.

Tom Williams and Miss Alice 
were guests In the Frank Shel­
don home one day last week.

Mrs. Florence Teague and Mrs 
Myrtle Roe spent Monday with 
friends and relatives In Brown­
wood.

Miss Hattie Barr and her aunt, 
Mrs. John House of New Mexico, 
left Sunday night for Gettys­
burg, Pa., to attend the old sol- 
d'er’s reunion. They will extend 
their visit on to Washington. D 
C., before returning home, to 
visit relatives In North Texas 
and N. M. Miss Hattie will be 
gone a month on her vacation 
leave from the post office.

M1.SS Artie Rickie will have 
charge of Uncle Sam’s affairs 
during Miss Hattie’s ab.sence.

Mr. and Mrs Tom Wollsey, of 
Hall, spent the week-end with 
their daughter and family, Mrs. 
J. W. Roe.

Ben Cox after almost three 
year’s confinement to his bed. is 
now able to be wheeled about In 
a wheel chair and enjoys these 
pleasant summer evenings out 
In the garden and on the front 
porch watching folks go by.

All the sick folks are better. 
John Hamilton Is home and able 
to sit up. Mrs. Bob Boykin Is 
better. Billie Miller has been 
brought home, but has a profes­
sional nurse with him.

TTiere was preaching Sunday 
at the Baptist Church by their

READ THE ADVER’nSEMENTS

When HEADACHE
Is Due to Constipation
Often one of the first-felt 

effects of constipation Is a 
headache. Take a dose or 
^ o  of Black-DraughtI 

T hat’s the sensible way — 
relieve the constipation. Enjoy 
the refreshing relief which 
thousands of people have re­
ported from the use of purely 
vegetable Black-Draught.

Sold In 25-cent packages.

BLACK-DRAUGHT
A GOOD LAXATIVE

Foot Comiort
“W hen your fee l hurt, you hurt all-over” 
K eep your feet com fortable by using. . . 
Dr. Scholl’s Foot R em edies— Dr. Jangs 
Foot A ppliances— Blue Jay Corn P a d s-  
-F reezon e  gets it— N oxacorn— Ice Mint 
— C alocide— N yal Corn Rem over

“SERVICE W ITH  A SA V IN G ”
— at—

H U D S O N  BRO S.
D ruggists

“What You Want, When You Want It”

G oldthw aite, T exas

pastor, Rev Cleveland. There 
was a good attendance.

Mr. and Mrs. Miilford Lee take 
their daily constitutional, roam­
ing the pastures In search of the 
turkey flock. Mr. and Mrs. Wal­
ton Moore try their dally dozen 
differently, they go horseback to 
round In their wayward poults. 
But that’s all too much for Clyde 
Clary, he is In search of a herd­
er. maybe has one by now, to go 
and come with hls roving, feath­
ered possessions.

“Thrashing" days are mostly a 
thing of the past now. The Lant 
Adams and Sheldon machines 
are through with the summer 
quota, and the Bud Harper crew 
Is exjjected home in a day or so. 
The Wylie Cook harvesters are 
still In the Moline section, but 
will probably flnl-sh soon.

Today the community folks 
met at the tabernacle to clean 
house for the summer meetings.

It remains for the different pas­
tors to put the finishing touches 
to the community annual clean­
ing Job. We pray that the Holy 
Spirit may be with them in a 
general cleaning up of sins and 
Satan’s cobwebs from our lives, 
and community.

'VCi PRKKLY HEAT-SUNBURN 
SISKIN IRRITATIONS W  

ATHLETES FOOT
èàmdiatdjìrt maU^SOrCAMS

HEYERS
PRICKLY HEAT POWDER

• •  A T .^V O U » O K U *  t T O M B - - - -

“L elo’s” for the Gum*
Do your gums Itch, bum, or 

cause you discomfort, druggist 
will refund your money If tlw 
first botUe of "LETTO’S falls to 
satisfy.

H U D SO N  BROS.

In Cold-Making 
Power... In Economy 
of Operation! See

J IM M IE  H U L L S
ARTISTS and M O D ELS

Tw o N ITES O NLY —  Tw o

d* '

B U ILD IN G  
H O M E S

In years to pay with $3 .50  inter- 
|00.00— No red tape! No delay .
pars to pay with 5 1-4 per cent

N o w — There w ill com e a 
you will want to borrow the  

jbuikl, but C A N ’T  g e l IT.

lEs & McCullough
^thing to Build A nything”
I Goldthwaite, T exas

W ednesday & Thursday, July 6 -7
30----- P E O PL E----- 30

14— V au deville  Features— 14
America’s Biggest and Most Beautiful Tent Theatre 

A TENT SHOW THAT IS DIFFERENT 
—OPENING PLAY

THE GIRL FROM PARIS
A Three-Act Comedy Packed With a Thousand Laughs 

Vaudeville, Singers, Dancers, Comedians Galore 
HOT SWING BAND

Clean, Wholesome Entertainment for All 
No Filth—No Vulgarity

COMPLETE CHANGE OF PLATS EACH NITE
Featuring in Person

Miss Tiny Hull
Late with Broadway’s Mu­

sical Melodies of 1938

Added Feature

‘Skinnie Kimling*
Ace of Blackface Comedians 
Formerly with Lasses IViilt«

Tent Doors Open at 7:30—Orchestra Curtain at 8:2S p. m.

CHILDREN

IOC
A D U L T S

gOC
BIG TENT LOCATED AT McGIRK WAGON TARD

And Look! For A 
Few Cents A Day
You can actually own one of these big, 
beautiful 1938 Kelvinators. Come in and 
let’s discuss low, easy payment terms— 
A few cents a day is all it takes I

DON’T DELAY! SEE 
THIS CHAMPION  
ICE-MAKER TODAYI

TFO B IG IC E  
I  im  CUBES FOR J i

at natronal average electric rates

Actual figures to prove Kelvinator’s 
amazing economy in ice-making I

Only Kelvinator 
Offers These Features:
•  Speedy-Cube Ice Release—fairly pops 
the cubes out of their traya.

•  Sliding Shelf Arrangement — makes 
room for large, bulky objects.

•  Built-in Thermometer • Vegetable 
Crisper and Bin.

•  America’s handsomest refrigerator.
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Letters of Interest From Mills County Communities
Jones ValTey

Bt Mrs. G«o. D. Brooks
¡W est Lake Merritt

Bv Min Inei RItrhIe

Mr and Mrs R w e  Upshaw of 
De Leon visited Mr. and Mrs. O. 
B Bell Wednesday Orenetta 
Bell returned home with them 
for a short visit.

Bro J Lovell Ponder. Mrs 
Ponder and children of Roches­
ter. Texas, spent the week with 
their sister. Mrs Geo D Brooks 
and family Bro Ponder preach­
ed for us Thursday night.

Mr and Mrs O B Bell and 
family visited Mr and Mrs W. 
B Wilcox Sunday.

Most all of the community en­
joyed a party In the Jake Brown 
home Saturday night. The club 
gave away a quilt, Mrs. Ira 
Hutchings was fortunate enough 
to draw the lucky number

Mrs J. P DelUs and Mrs O. B 
Petty spent Saturday In the 
John Dellls home.

Mrs Kate Thompson of Sny­
der had to return home Sunday 
because of serious ear trouble 
She had Intended visiting for ■ 
month In the Brooks home We 
were so s o r r y  to have 
her visit cut short but realise 
It U best for her to go to a ear 
specialist

Mr and Mrs A D Kirk are 
the proud parents of a 8 1-S-lb., j noon, 
daughter, bom June 25. Mrs 
Kirk is with her mother, Mrs 
Traylor, at Rock Springs

Mr and Mrs Oeo Brook.s and 
Mr and Mrs Earl Hale called at 
the Traylor home Sunday to 
aee Mrs Kirk and baby

Mr and Mrs Odine Renfro 
spent last week In the B P. Ren­
fro home at Rock Springs.

Visitors In the Arthur Wilcox 
borne Sunday were Mr and Mrs 
Oeo Brooks and family and Bro 
Tolliver

Raymond Wilcox spent Satur- 
Baba visited their daughter, Mrs 
Arthur WUcox and family Prl- 
tfay.

Mias Faye Stuck was a guest 
of Millie Frances Hutchings Sat­
urday night.

Felton Waddell and family 
.spent Thursday In Santa Anna.

Billie Bryant returned to 
Winters Sunday after a week’s 
vUlt In the W J. Morris home

Travis Long and wife and Mrs. 
J. W Long visited with Mrs. 
Tommie Long Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. Stuck and Faye, and Mrs 
Felton Waddell, visited with 
Mrs C O Norton Friday after-

Jake Brown and family spent 
Sunday In the Cornelius home 
at Ridge

E. B Davis and wife and Mrs. 
Ullle Ooodwln of Breckenrldge, 
were Sunday visitors In the C. O. 
Norton home

R E Clements and wife visit­
ed In the IraHutchlngs home 
Sunday afternoon.

Miss Loralne Caloway spent 
Tuesday with Ina Belle Petty.

Mrs Jewell Bennett and 
daughter, went to Brady Tues­
day, after several days visit In 
the home of her sister, Mrs. W. 
L Stuck.

Lo ng &  B e rry
• t S P E C I A L S : -

G oldthw aite T exas

Tomatoes 3 lbs. 6C
Nice and Fresh

I
I

----- 1
IPeas z lbs 3 c

Fresh From the Farm

I Vinegar gal.
I Brins your Jug

Pork & Beans 3 for
Full Pound Cans

15cl
— I 

:| 

I

14c

English Peas 2 for
G l enn Valley No. 2 can

21c

J e llo 6 Flavors
E A C H S C

M orton’s

PotatoChips 7Pkg
You will need them July < 

L ibby’s fa ll Ca^s

25c

TomatoJuice 3„„, 22c

Rock Springs
By Mrs. Eula NIckob

There was a large crowd at 
both services at church Sunday. 
Bro Wade brought two good ser­
mons.

We extend our deepest sym­
pathy to Mrs Lula Oatlln and 
her children In the going of her 
son, Walton, who passed away 
Sunday afternoon in New York. 
May Ood’s richest blessings rest 
on each of you is our prayer We 
also extend sympathy to Mrs. 
John Ediln in the going away of 
her brother-in-law, Mr. McGee, 
who lived In San Saba County.

Mrs. Nannie Jackson from 
town attended church Sunday 
morning.

Mrs. W A Daniel spent Mon­
day afternoon at her father’s 
home. Will Drnnard, In Big Val­
ley. She also called In the Ro­
bertson home.

Marvin Spinks and family 
s]>ent Sunday afternoon In the 
Cooke home.

R C. Jackson and wife and 
Mrs Bula Nickols visited In the 
Lowe home Sunday afternoon

A. D Kirk and wife from Jones 
Vsiley are spending a few weeks 
with her mother, Mrs Maggie 
'Traylor. A little daughter ar 
rived at 9 o'clock Saturday night 
to make her home with them.

Prof Horace Cooke had busi­
ness In Melvin the first of the 
week. He was elected as one of 
the teachers. He has been 
teaching In Mills County for a 
number of years. We wish him 
good luck.

Beryl Vann Roberts spent Sat­
urday night and Sunday with 
his uncle James Nickols and 
vrife.

Richard Sowders and family 
.spent Saturday night and Sun­
day In San Saba with relaUves.

Mrs. Harvey Dunkle visited In 
Woody Traylor’s home last 
week.

Hillard Dyches from Brecken­
rldge spent Saturday night In 
the Robertson home.

E D. Robertson and family 
went to Caradan Friday to the 
workers meeting.

M R Circle. Duey Bohannon 
and James Roberts went fishing 
Friday night. James was the 
lucky fisherman.

J D Lowe and family from 
Jack.sonville visited his parents 
last week.

J. F. Davis and wife had lots 
of company from Brosvnwood 
last week and this week.

Jim and Homer Circle and 
wives from San Saba visited 
Friday night with their parents 
and .sl.stcr.

---------- o----------

South Bennett
By Mrs. M. L. Casbeer

UBBY S NO. 2 'i  C ANS— C(K A COLA— DR. PEPPER— |
P E A R S

f  cons .. 45c 6 Bottles
Plus Deposit ,25c!

O range Juice
Tan can 9c

RAN< H h ouse-
s a l t

loe lbs. ____ 59c
S te a k  ''t'¡t::’''*29c
Dressed Fryers

A t the cheapest P rice w e have ever had

Thig store w ill be c losed  July 4th

We had a good crowd at Sun­
day .school Sunday. The Chalk 
talk given by Mrs. Jack Robert­
son wa-s enjoyed Immensely by 
those present. Let’s all try to be 
there Sunday.

Mrs. ESnily Blackburn and son. 
Simon. left la.st week for a visit 
with relatives and friends In 
Arkansas. Simon also planned 
to go on to Kansas where he will 
work several weeks.

Mrs. Emmett Piles and small 
■son, Emmett Wright Piles from 
South Texas have been visiting 
with her sister, Mrs. Claud 
Smith the past two weeks.

Bina Beth and Sybil Ca-sbeer 
■spent .several days the first of 
the week with their grandpa­
rents, Mr. and Mrs B. R Ca.s- 
beer at town.

Elton Horton and family 
were guests In the Clyde Feath 
erston home. Sunday.

J. M and Valeria Stacy, Odell 
Casbeer, Wanda Kerby, and 
Houston Kuykendall dined In 
the M. L. Casbeer home Sunday.

Rob Simpson spent Saturday 
night In the Walter Simpson 
home.

Jack Montgomery and family 
were guests of Cileve Perry and 
family Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Smith 
Joined a number of their rela­
tives at the river Sunday, for a 
family get together.

--------o------ —

Center Point
By OveUa Weason

There were twenty-one pres­
ent at Sunday School Sunday 

Henry Blmp.sim and family 
spent Thursday with Harvey 
Simpson and family near U>me- 
ta.

^Hull T ent Show to Be 
Here July 6 -7

W m. A . A sh ley  
Buried W ednesd ay

! ^oliticsl 
Anne

Tommie B. Cunningham visit­
ed Garland and Alvin Spinks 
Thursday.

Mrs. C. O. Stark called on Mrs 
Craig Wesson Tuesday morning.

Mrs. Warren Wilson and oeby 
visited her sister, Mrs. Elam 
Wright and family Monday.

Florence Davis, Ruthle Stark 
and Lucille Taylor spent Sun­
day with Zona Lee Perry.

Mrs. Bob Martin visited Mrs 
Sam Self 'ntursday.

Mrs. Kate Shelton spent Sat­
urday night with her sister, Mrs 
Julia Taylor and children.

Craig Wesson called In the O. 
E. Rice home In Mullln Thurs­
day.

Elaine, Iva Lou and Frances 
Beth Simpson spent Thursday 
night with Henry Simpson.

Eammon Perry who is In the 
CCC Camp, located at Lake 
Brownwood spent the week end 
at home.

Calvert Hall ford and family 
had as guests during the week 
end their relatives.

Sam Self spent Thursday af­
ternoon with Rpv J. D. Long.

Oran Stark visited his grand­
mother, Mrs J C Stark and J 
T. at Rock Springs Friday.

We extend our deepest sym-

Jlmmle Hull’s players, one of 
America’s biggest and most ela­
borate tent theatres. U coming 
here for a two-night engage­
ment Wednesday and 'Thursday. 
July a and 7.

In bringing thU company to 
this city the management wishes 
to especially emphasise the fact 
that the Jimmie Hull Players ta 
one of the oldest snd most re­
liable tent theatres on the road, 
being In the sixteenth year and 
now In Its 878 consecutive week.

Originally organised as a stock 
company, the show has enjoyed 
long permanent engagements In 
Dallas, Houston. Galveston, Port 
Arthur and Beaumont (the last 
named city being the home of 
Mr Hull.)

“Jimmie” (as he is known to 
his legion of friends) has com­
bined his three units (dramatic, 
musical and vaudeville) into two 
big evening’s entertainment.

The cast Is headed by Sklnnle 
Klmllng, the “Ace” of black face 
comedians and a late feature 
with the Lasses White Minstrels 
and Tiny Hull, "The Personality 
Girl,’’ supported by a large cost 
offering the three act laughing 
hit, "The Girl From Paris."

Harry S Warner, late feature. 
“ The Girl From Paris,“ of Chi­
cago will be here In person.

The management guarantees 
the show to be clean and whole­
some and free from vulgarity.

The .  
“**̂ 6 the fot 

««»»«etkl
Bedinj

For Senater
® M. DAVO 
PÏNR088VI

frank :
D L. TRlOrr

The Orim Reaper claimed 
another of San Baba County’s 
prominent cltlsens and ranch­
men. late Monday night, when 
the spirit of William A. Ashley 
quietly took Its flight at the 
family residence, while he slept 

Death Is believed to have come 
about 11:30 p. m.

He was stricken with a heart 
attack some week.s ago, and had  ̂For I 
been In a more or less precarious ! Toibbit Pa 
condition since. About a week 
ago. he suffered another attack, 
from which he was believed to 
be gradually Improving 

Funeral oervlccs, largely at­
tended, were held from the 
family residence here Wednes- _
day morning at 9:30 o’clock, con- 
ducted bj' Bro. Clem Hoover of | « -7*!®’ I 
the Church of Christ, Brady. ' ,  L

Burial was at the Gray Ceme-1 ’
tery at Cherokee In the family 
plot, where three of their child­
ren. who died at an early age, 
are Interred.—Son Saba News ' _ — _  -

Mr. A-shley was a  brother of! 
our local townsman L. B. Aah-| 
ley, who has the sympathy o f, 
friends here.

For nMmty w  1 
J. OBlAU)

For Coaaty ! 
^  B. PCWiB

For Coaaty ' 
W. L BU^ 
SAMHBIRTi

TRAVIS 11 
MRS. B. ;

For Cowako^j 
' O. H. SHAW

M cCraw's A id e  
H ere M onday

pathy to the Bratton family In i entertainment for
the loss of their dear son and I whole family

Lower Ih’anconla In Bavaria Is 
the richest and best cultivated ol 
Franciscan circles; noted for Its 
excellent wines and mineral 
springs.

------------0------------
Srrewworm Medicine. R. L.

brother, Woodrow. Woodrow 
was among the last graduating 
class of Mulltn high school and a 
young man just .starting out in 
life. He leaves many frlend.s 
and loved one.- who will miss him 
greatly. May the Great Com­
forter bless all of the bereaved.

Ferdinand and Elmon Simp­
son spent Thursday night with 
their cousin, Elmo Simpson.

Mrs. C O. Stark visited Mmes. 
Miracle, Collier and MeWharter 
in town Monday. i

C r a i g  Wesson visited Will' 
Spinks Thursday.

Mmes. Bob Martin and Sam 
Self spent Thursday afternoon 
with Mrs. John Ediln.

Arlle Tayl<" and Merlene, 
Stark visited Dorothea Davi.s 
Sunday.

Ray Davis spent Saturday | 
night with Rev. J. D. Long. i 

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Shelton j 
and baby, Mrs. Kate Shelton and j 
Amos Shelton spent Wednesday ' 
afternoon in the C. C. Wesson | 
home. I

Rube Henry brought his sister.! 
Mrs Henry Simpson, and child- j 
ren home Wednesday, from San I 
Angelo where she has been at | ( 
the bedside of her mother.: | 
Elaine and Elmo returned home 
with him Friday for several 
week’s visit.

E T. Falrman bought the old 
rock hou.se on the J. M. Mays 
farm.

Wyno Lee French vl.slted her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mr«. L 
W. French Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ollie Shelton, 
Garl Perry and children, Gor­
man. Gladys, Eammon, Sherman 
and Zona Lee, Merlene, Oran and 
Ruthle Stark. Arlle and Lucille 
Taylor, Dorothea Marie and 
Florence Davis, Juneve and Do- 
orthy Nell Tyson and Elmo Fal­
lon enjoyed a trip to Bozar Sun­
day afternoon.

Ovelia Wesson U on the sick 
list.

Mr.<;. Craig Wesson and child­
ren spent Sunday visiting rela­
tive.« at Mullln.

The party in the Garl Perry 
home Saturday night, given in 
honor of the birthdays of Zona 
Lee Perry and Ovelia We.sson. 
was attended by a large crowd.

There Is also a red hot swing 
band and orchestra and a world 
of real up-to-the-minute singing 
and dancing novelty vaudeville 
acts that will appeal to all.

The big tent Is water-proof 
and wrlll be located on the Mc­
Girk Wagon Yard.

o-

Dlck Stout, who spoke here on 
May 13 at the Methodist Church 
Brotherhood Banquet, brought 

his “McCraw Good Will Special” 
to Goldthwaite Monday, June 27

Stout resigned as assistant at- | ^
tomey general on June 17, to 
campaign for his former chief, 
Wiiliam McCraw, a leading can­
didate for the governorship. He 
Is making a 10.000-mlle good will 
tour and covered two thousand 
miles during the first week, mak­
ing many talks In the interest of 
McCraw’s candidacy.

Accompanying Stout is John 
Geer, University of Texas senior 
and treasurer of the Wesley 
Foundation. University of Texa' 
Methodist student organisation.

For Cos
I J. A
' For
I A A. DOWHB j 

H. R. (Roktll 
w. L BABXa! 
J. a  iHobatii 
KEDIANBI

EOQlJK8S0 
REIDEM. 
OBO. D Bl 

For Jastietd 
No. L
JAMBS RAHl

II \M1LT0<( I

On Nov. 7,1869, 68 vessels of 
various nations began the fi.it 
pas.sage through the Suez Canal

Come to Hai 
Bring • your; 
stock honst 
lance thr*« ti!

The picture shows McCraw i jjjf, 
wishing his former assistant sue-1 
cess at the outset of the frlp.; gjoo to $4« in 
which will take him to all p a ru ! 
of Texas.

Aov. .R EA D  THE

M

The Summer Harxest of V alu es in Goldthwaite UI 
the M erchants invite you to share in the many bsfi* 
ed next . . . .

T U E S D A Y , JU l'

T i f â ^ e s  D
Card o f Thanks

We wish to thank our many i 
frlend.s for the klndnesse.s shown 
us during the illness and death ' 
of our husband and father, and ; 
for the many beautiful flowers, j i 

May God bless each of you. , | 
Mrs. E I. MAGEE and family ! j

l«i Goldthwaite
A lso m ade possible by the Merchants ¡*

Fre e  P ic tu re  Slî
at The Melba Theatr«!

Steen a  Son.

Deer In Penn.sylvanla are so 
numerous as to be threat« i^ l 
with starvation due to lack of 
forage.

---------- o----------
Red Ant KiUer. R. L. Steen At j 

Son. i

— SH O W IN G —

TAB3^AN*S r e v e n o »
A fine show we know you w ill all like  ̂

here. Share in the m any bargains and sec the FR*

t1
)in
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/ster Moon, Lo- 
¿iss Greta Hines 
»kt MW Iva Lee 

_  ns Port Worth 
l^turday, to her 
V, Arkansas.

bhore of Temple 
^ th  Mrs. Will 

loraoe Denison.

[ a a. Floyd and 
]er May and Mary 

are vUltlng In 
rhome. Mr. Floyd 

■Mrs. Moon

Mrs. W. 8. Warren of 81ms, 
Ark., is visiting her daughter, 
Mrs. Tommy Dennis, and old 
friends In BCllls County. Also 
Mrs. Daurla Palmer of Wetumka, 
Okla., Is visiting her sister, Mrs. 
DennU.

The Yellow River, called 
“China’s 8orrow,” because of Its 
frequent disastrous floods, has 
changed Its course across China 
seven times within historical 
times.

irta Peaches
•half bushel 7 8 c
*icnic Supplies
Itper Plates
ips
b̂le Cloths 

IX Paper

Spoons 
Picnic Sets 
Napkins 
Forks

|R DILL-

2'  10c
Summer Drinks

Ittles
ling drink for your July 4th picnic

er Snaps lb. 10c
JS -

thmallows lb. 12c

ives
Stuffed

Pim entoes
4-oz. c a n ________9c

'ggs Corn Flakes!
Size P ackages—

Ilo any Flavor S C
^TOCK—

!s 5 lb. 2 5 c
fDGE - 6  BO XES

les carton 18c
)CK—

100
Lbs. $1.75

ssed Fryers
chickens have been pen-fed and 

good condition. A  real treat
>icnics.

M eats-C heese-C heese Spreads

'ICE ROASTS
ilay of Roasts for your selection . 
'‘ meats are hom e-killed and our 
low in order to keep our m eats 

the best condition.

BARBECUE— FRESH  FISH

»■e Closed M onday, July 4th
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ISOCIETY
Entertained With 
Party

Bill M cCraw. |
‘The Cam paignin’est 
Feller in T exas” !

Friday evening, June 24, the 
Intermediate Sunday School 
Class, of the Pleasant Grove 
Sunday School, their families, 
and a few guests were entertain­
ed with a party given by their 
teacher, Mrs. Arthur Robbins.

The guests began to arrive 
about an hour before sundown. 
Part of them were swimming, 
part wading, while others were 
just watching.

About dark a grinding souird 
was heard and upon investiga 
tlon It was found to be Ice 
cream freezers.

At about 8:15 o’clock Ice 
cream , cake and cookies were 
served to about forty guests.

Everyone had a hilarious time 
and no one was mlsslng._A 
Quest.

------------0----------- -

A nnouncem ent Party
Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Stuck en 

tertained a number of their 
friends, ’Tuesday afternoon, with 
a formal party, announcing the 
approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Faye, to Wiley Griffin 
of Sulphur Springs, formerly of 
this community.

The home was appropriately 
decorated In blue bells. Various 
games were played and enjoyed 
by all. Music was furnished by 
Miss Mary June Perryman.

’The refreshment plate consist­
ed of fruit punch and heart- 
shaped cookies. Plate favors 
were miniature paint brushes, 
tied with tiny white ribbon bows, 
with the Inscription, “Faye and 
Wiley."

At a late hour we bade our 
host and hostess goodbye and 
wished for the future bride much 
happiness.—A Quest.

I
It was a grizzled old native of 

the clay hill of East Texas who 
best described Bill MrCraw, at 
torney general and candidate 
for governor.

T hat’s the campalgn’est fel-
ler I ever seen,' 
marvelled.

the old man

Bowm an s Honored
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bowman 

have extra cause this week for 
being proud of their talented 
children. Mi.ss Clara Bowman 
has been named Duchess of 
Ooldthwaite for the Brady Jubi­
lee. Miss Virginia was elected 
English teacher in the El Campo 
high school, and John won state 
wide honors In the FFA debate 
as noted elsewhere In this Issue. 

---------- o----------
ATTENDS HOME-COMING

W. E. Miller returned Tuesday, 
after attending the Ladonia 
home-ccming celebration last 
Sunday. 'There were about 1.800 
persons present, some coming 
from New York and California 
and many other states. Con­
gressman Rayburn and Mr. 
Miller, two former Ladonia boys, 
were invited on the platform to 
speak In place of any absentee 
speakers on the program. 

---------- o----------
HONOR STl’DENTS

STEPHENVILLE —Edith Thomp­
son of Elbony and Wilson Shave 
of Star were named honor stu­
dents at John Tarleton College 
today In a report released from 
Registrar Charlie S. Wilkin’s of­
fice after reports of second pre­
liminary grades were In.

’These students were included 
on the semester honor roll.

Honor roll students are re­
quired to make 30 grade points 
during the semester.

———— o--------—
WANTS MORE NEWS

A letter from Mrs. Littlepage 
of Mineral Wells In which she 
extends her subscription to the 
Eagle, asks that Center City, 
North Bennett and Caradan cor­
respondents write more regular­
ly. '  '

Thanks Mrs. Littlepage, We 
will try to Induce them.

------------0-----------
Mr. and Mrs. F. D. Webb, Mrs. 

Charles Frizzell, Mrs. E. M. 
Steele and daughter. Miss Lil­
lian Ruth, drove to Moline Sun­
day afternoon. Mrs. Steele and 
daughter remained for a visit 
with relatives.

Just now there are 12 other
candidates In the governor’s race
who are finding out the same 
thing as they attempt to keep! 
up the campaign pace set by 
McCraw. For the tall, strong, 
•sandy red-haired attorney gen­
eral is holding a pace unparel- 
leled In Texas campaign hUstory

The Arlington printer’s devil 
who became Texas’ highest law 
officer .sometimes makes as many 
as 20 speeches In a day, and 
rarely shakes less than 1,000 
hands of friends, old and new, 
who have come to pledge their 
suport. McCraw often travels 
700 or 800 miles In a day or night 
to keep speaking engagements In 
widely .separated parts of tre 
mendous Texas, and what Is 
more remarkable, he keeps It up 
week after week, never missing 
a chance to campaign from the 
time he gets up until he finally 
has to turn in at night, often 20 
hours later.

In all his camp.'iignlng, BUI 
ha.s never been seriously late for 
a speaking engagement but once 
That happened when the zipper 
on his trousers failed to "zip" as 
he was dressing at his home 200 
miles from the speaking engage­
ment. He wrestled with the 
gadget, and finally got In the 
car, holding his pants together 
As a friend drove. Bill sat In the 
back seat, trying to make that 
zpiper zip.

Finally, he had to get a tailor 
to work on the pants. The tail­
or. after a half-hour, gave It up 
and gave Bill some safety pins 
He made his speech, pinned to­
gether. an hour and half late.

Just after McCraw wa.s elect-i 
attorney general, a newspaper 
acquaintance ran Into one of 
McCraw’s close.st friends.

"When Is Bill going to start 
campaigning for governor?" the 
newspaperman asked. Bill’s 
friend smiled. "When has he 
ever stopped?" he asked back

Tuesday, July s

T rades Day
1

and through the week
Remnant Silks

Length, from 18in. to 2 yds. 
Special per inch _____ Ic

Silk Counter
U p to 98c per yard  

This Season’s Silks, yd. 59c

Dollar Dresses
W e have just recevied  

20  D ozen

Double Curtains
98c values, p a ir ---------- 63c

White Shoes
48  pair Shoes up to $3.95  

Special, only 95c
$1 .95  Shoes $1 .59
$2.95  Shoes $1.95

Others in Proportion

Summer Goods
R egular Counter 25 & 35c  
Yard 15c

81 Sheeting
BEST G RADE

81 inch B r o w n   22c
81 inch Bleach    25c

MEN S SHIRTS
Bought for this Sale— 79c and 98c

W e w ill have Special V alues in Short Lot M erchandise

LITTLE'S
G oldthw aite, T exas

Newsprint M ill Seen  
As Start o f Boom

Lometa FFA  
Poultry Projects

Mrs. Lucile Falrmati was hoit- 
, CM to a few friends at Lake Mer- 
¡ritt Wednesday evening with a 
beefsteak supper in honor of Mr. 
and Mrs. Chas. Ragland who 
have returned after a month’s 
vacation In North Texas.

----- - - o
RmI Ant Killer. R. L. Steen A 

Son.

Boys enrolled in vocational 
agriculture In I>ometa High 
School and who have the rais­
ing of poultry as one of their 
projects have been most success­
ful In producing pullets and 
broilers for market and home 
u.se, report.s J. M Starr, V. A. 
teacher and FFA Chapter Advi­
sor.

Five of the boys obtained their 
single combed White Leghorn 
chicks from A. II Demke. St;- 
phenvllle. Texa.s. This strain of 
White Leghorns were bred on 
the John Tarleton Agricultural 
Collegs Farm and the chickens 
were tested for Pullonim disease 
or bacillary white diarrhea un­
der the supervision of the Lead 
of the Tarleton Poultry D e p a r t t  

ment. 'The.se five boys, L. D. 
Petty, Thurman Head. M. F. Kir­
by, Vernon Jones, and J. L. Mc­
Lean, now have fine flocks of 
pullets and cockrels of the high 
producing strain of White Leg­
horns bred and raised by John 
Tarleton Agricultural College.

Several others of the Lometa 
V. A. pupils have White Leghorns 
and other breeds of chickens 
which they obtained from promi­
nent poultry breeders of the 
State. Some of these boys are- 
Marvin Miller, Leslie R. Here­
ford, Jr., J. T. Fl.sher, Weldon 
Elmore, Wilton H o p p e r  and 
Charles Elders.

Pullets from these poultry pr,:- 
jects are being kept by the Lo­
meta Future Farmers to make 
up or Increase the laying flock 
for this winter and next year. 
'The cockerels are being disposed 
of as broilers and in some In­
stances are being .«¡old by the I.o- 
meta boys for breeding purpo.se.s.

L. D. Petty, Vernon Jones and 
J. L. McLean have sold or have 
had Inquiries for .several of their 
White Leghorn cockrels. If any 
other persons want to get bre»d- 
Ing birds from the Lometa voca­
tional agriculture pupils they 
may reserve them from the boys 
named above or .see J. M. Starr, 
the Lometa vocational agricul­
ture teacher. X

TRADE AT HOME

The Southern Newspaper Pub­
lishers’ Association Wednesday 
adjourned Its thirty-sixth annual 
convention after receiving from 
James G Stahlman, chairman 
of the newsprint plant was ready 
to be built.

Mr. Stahlman said that after 
four years of negotiations and 
study by the S.N.P.A. his com­
mittee successfully finished ten­
tative plans for starting the 
plant in July at Lufkin, Texa.s.

“I honestly believe,” said Mr. 
Stahlman, publisher of the Nash 
vlUe Banner and president of the 
American Newspaper Publishers' 
Association, "that the minute 
this first unit starts producing, 
we shall see an influx of news­
print mills In the South and the 
greatest Industrial development 
the South has ever shown.”

He said his committee. In spite 
of di-scouragements. had refused 
to listen to adverse talk but had 
contracted for about 800.000 tons 
of newsprint to be manufactured 
by the mill.

He said: “We were advised In 
the beginning by a sound banker 
that the only way to put the 
mill over would be for the bank­
ers to partlcipiate. We thought 
we knew better. I came to the 
conclusion that It would not be 
built unless the publishers put 
their money Into the project ’’

He announced a good portion 
of the $7.500.000 needed for the 
n’Ui had been subscribed In 
rtcck.

"I have been asked what I 
could pet out of it,” he added. "I 
am te'-ing you now—not one red 
cent In stock. I said In the be­
ginning that I would not have 
one cent of stock In the mill and 
I am telling you now I would not 
profit from anything I did for 
the Southern Newspaper Pub­
lishers’ Asscolatlon."

A few don’ts for the 4th of 
July celebration would not be 
amiss.

1. Don’t be careless in the 
handling of explosives.

2. Don’t look into firecrackers 
which have failed to explode.

3. Don’t drive recklessly and 
at excess speeds.

4. Don’t overdo in swimming, 
especially in water of unknow.a 
depth

5. Last and most important: 
Don’t fail to get prompt medical 
attention if a wound Is suffered.

---------- o-----------

IN THE DISTRICT COl'RT OF' 
THE CNITED ST.4TES FOR THE 
NORTHERN DISTRICT OF 
TEXAS. SAN ANGELO DIVISION

Flying conditions over the Alps 
vary greatly, and require the 
highest degree of skill and nerve. 

--------- o---------- -
Brazil has a tree porcupine 

whose quills are not as long or 
strong as those in North Ameil- 
ca.

----------o----------

IN THE .M.XTTER OF JESSE T» 
GEESLIN B.\NKRCPT.
NO. T-il. IN BANKRl'PTCY.
San Angelo, Texas June 29. 1938, 

Creditors of Jesse T Oeesllu 
of Ooldthwaite, Texas, are bere- 

! by notified, that on the 27th day 
cf June, 1938. the -said Jes.se T. 
Oeeslin. flle-i his petition herelrx 
praying for a decree of the Court 

I discharging him from all debts 
: provable against his estate Irt 
bankruptcy except such debts a.9 
are by law specially excepted froirv. 
such discharge, and said petitio'v 
having been referred to me an 
Special Master, IT IS ORDERED 
that any creditor or other party 
In interest who may desire to. 
oppose the granting of the dls-

Mrs. W. c. Dew who has re- I charge as prayed for in said pe-
cently returned from a visit to 
her nieces in Beaumont and 
Nederland is preparing to leave . 
about the 15th for Long Beach, 
California to join her friends,' 
the Reynolds from Moody an d ' 
sp>end the rest of the summer in j 
a cooler climate. ,

tltlon, must on or before the 30tl> 
day of July, 1938, file with tho 
undersigned formal notice o t 
such Intention, together with 
sjjeclflcatlons pf objection there­
under.

CARTER T. DALTON,
Special Master.

AMERICAN BUSINESS— 
(Continued from Page One) 

price reductions ranging from 
$150 to $650 on crawler-type 
tractors, effective Immediately. 
Other manufacturers. It Is be­
lieved, win soon meet the price 
cuts In this type of tractor. While 
price reductions on their ma­
chinery of production Is welcom­
ed by farmers at any time, the 
present case is particularly time­
ly since farmers are faced with 
the prospect of receiving lower 
Incomes from their crops.

W H A T  O N E  CASE of EG G S ! 

W ILL  DO!
One ra.se of eggs will now buy almost two sacks of good 

egg mash. Good eggs are going to be a good prire from 
now on, and it takes a good feed to produce good eggs that 
will stand up during this hot weather. MID-TEX EGG 
Mash is the Hot Weather Feed. It produces eggs that will 
stand up longer during hot weather. It also protects the 
health of your Hen. And you can buy almost two sacks with 
one case of eggs.

B r in g  us your POULTRY, EGGS, and CREAM. We of­
fer top prices and appreciate your patronage.

Our Store will be closed MONDAY. JULY 4th. but we 
invite you to visit us TRADES DAY, TUESDAY, JULY 5th.

Gerald-Worley
Company
PHONE $28
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T H E  G O L D T H W A I T E  E A G L E  Another Scrap O ’ Paper
PubllshMI Every Friday by The EAGLE PUBLISHING CO.

MRS R M THOMPSON 
Editor and Publisher
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-«nFle Copies - ------------------ -
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Any erroneous reflection upon the character, standing or 
Nputatlon of any person, firm or corporation which may appear 
El the columns of this paper, will be glacly corrected upon due 
<aotlce of same being given to the editor personally at this office.

E V E N  U N TO  TH E END
The death of Rev J Grady Timmins In San Antonio Sunday 

has shocked and saddened thousands of his friends throughout 
Texas and the South. It Is rare to find a man In these material­
istic days whe can win the personal devotion of other men, but 
Orady Timmons was such a man. The impress of h!s dynamic, 
likeable personality will not follow h;m to the grave. The light 

th a t he has brought to others will be carried a'oft and afar
It was the privilege of the writer to have known him at the 

beginning of his ministry, not long after he had been honorably 
cllscharged from the U. S Marine Corps with whom he had serv­
ed with distinction on the bloody fields of France. He was still a 
fighter and he never let up.

Though soon the pastor of one of the large.st. wealthiest, and 
most fashionable city churches in Methodism, Grady Timmons 
did not compromise with wrongdoing or with sin. He led the 
battle for right living outside the church as well as In it. And 
yet he was so sincere, so forthright, so honest in his own life, he 
seemed to aroase little If any personal anlmoji.y

Last year he made a trip around the world, gaining a vast 
•store of Information Although too many minds the Impact of 
first-hand knowledge cf the Inhumanity and de>ravity that rules 

so much of the world today has brought only defeatism and des­
pair, to Grady Timmons It brought a challenge.

He had always been a hard worker, new he worked harder 
than  ever before to bring to the hearts of men and women a 
realization that Christianity, undiluted and unadorned, is the 
only unfailing resource left this disillusioned and disturb'd world 

And new he has gone, the eloquence of his Ups .'tilled forever, 
the magnetic grip of his hand relaxed, his uncounted acts of 
friendllnts.' and charity abruptly ended

We are tempted to ask why such a man should be taken just 
as he has reached the height of his powers and Influence. The 
answer Is easy to find but hard to accept Grady Timmons Is 
gone because he did too much, because there was too much work 
for one man to do. His physical body, strong and sturdy though 
U seemed, could not stand the pace he set for It. And the reason 
Orady Timmons had too much to do was because there are too 
few other men who would help. There were plenty to clap him 
on the back and urge him on. but too few to stand shoulder to 
shoulder with him against Injustice and wrongdoing In high 
Pta 'es as well as low. In Texas as well as In China

That Is the tragedy of Grady Timmon’s early passing—not 
th a t his work Is ended, but that the Indifference of the many 
force their rightful burden on hi^ overloaded shoulders.

To his sorrowing family and friends he leaves an Inspiring heri­
tage. an example of unswerving devotion to the right, cf unfailing 

thoughtfulne.s.s and kindliness, and an unselfishness almo.st un- 
fikrallelrd Truly, In the words of David, he Inclined his heart to 
perform God’s statutes always, even unto the end.

--------------------o--------------------

EDITORIAL COMMENT
VIEWS OF THE NATION'S PRESS ON TOPICS OP INTEPEST
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SEE E I H T O K I A l^ ’ FR E E D O M  O F T H E  PR E S S”

C occidiosis Threatens The Community 
T exas Poultry Flocks Newspaper

FREEDO M  OF TH E PRESS
That time of election year has now arrived when the ean- 

didates for state office are beginning to fill their slings with 
political mud. Not every candidate Is so Inclined, but some 
who Ignored their opponents to begin with are now entreating 
the pre.ss of Texas to spread the news far and wide that the 
said opponents are Incapable, dishonest, unworthy and as 
vnueh else as they might print.

Of course It’s all good clean fun as far as the candidates 
are concerned. Most of them are lawyers, and a lawyer soon 
W m s to call the oppiosing counsel In a hotly contested case 
all that the presiding judge will allow, and then, after the case 
Is over, put his arm about him and sit down for a friendly 
drink of coffee or what have you. with no hard feelings.

Some of these candidates profess surprise that the news­
papers are not willing to assist them In the gentle art of de­
famation. but past campaigns have made even the most Inno­
cent new.spaper editor wise, and few or none of the.se reckless 
•charges appear In print The reason Is obvious: the abu.sed 
candidate knows that a libel suit against another candidate Is 
•only a waste of time and money, but a suit against a news­
paper. might bring him damages. We don’t recall any that 
have, by the way, but several of the larger papers in Texas, 
which were popularly believed to be rolling In wealth, have had 
to  defend themselves against such suits.

To guard against such gentry, the press of Texa.s—and the 
radio, too—is sometimes compelled to omit what Is legitimate 

•ew s To that extent the ijolltlc Ians succeed In destroying the 
cherished "freedom of the press." But for the most part the

I COLLEGE STA.—During June 
I and July coccidiosls will threaten 
i baby chicks between the ages of 
4 to 12 weeks, according to Geo. 
P McCarthy, poultryman of the 
Ebetension Service of ’Texas AdcM 
College.

Coccidiosls. caused by micro­
scopic parasites which multiply 
rapidly In the Intestinal tract. Is 
easily recognized by such symp­
toms as ruffled feathers, loss of 
color, rapid emaciation, and 
bloody droppings.

The disesise Is spread by con­
tamination of the feed, water, 
and soil with droppings of the 
fowls, and may be carried by 
water, or on shoes, grain sacks, 

' and other objects. It Is also 
spread by birds and Insects 

' which fly from one poultry 
yard to another.

It Is almost Impossible to era­
dicate the disease, but poultry 
demonstrators and county ag­
ricultural and home demonstra­
tion agents have found that 
rigid sanitation may keep It 
frem getting a start In a flock.

Dry floors, especially around 
the water fountains, and the us? 
of deep, dry litter that is stirred 
frequently will help keep dowm 
the disease.

"A mild soda flush m.ade of one 
tablespoon of soda to each gal­
lon of drinking water, when giv­
en to the chicks once a week, 
•seems to be a very effective con­
trol practice,” McCarthy said. 
"The m!Tk flush Is also very 
popular and should be given In­
stead of water for a day as soon 
as blood Is noticed In the drop­
pings.

"After the first day, the water 
may be replaced, and both milk 
and water offered to the chicks 
for a 10-day period. Skim milk 
may be used."

Turning from the city to the 
small town press exchanges that 
come to the editor’s desk Is like 
stepping from the slums, full of 
vice. Into an old fashioned gar­
den sweet with lavender and 
thyme and the scent of peren­
nial flowers The pages of the 
big dallies are so full of murder, 
thelvery. Immorality, and self­
ishness that the better news Is 
obscured by these glaring shat- 
terlngs of the Decalogue One 
puts the paper aside with a feel­
ing of depre.s.sion and heartache 
that the world Is so full of ter­
rible and unhappy things.

Then picking up the papiers 
that record the happenings of 
the little towT..' around us. one 
gains renewed faith In life Her? 
are set forth only that which 
uplifts a community—the activi­
ties of the business men, the 
church Items, the happy social 
gatherings of the people, the 
marriages, births and deatKs, 
farmers' Items and all the thou­
sand and one dally occurrences 
that make up the simple annals 
of the great common people, who 
are really the foundation of this 
country of ours.

Scandals are seldom published 
In the country newspapers, but 
If It happens that decency de­
mands It, the uglier details arc 
omitted or given a kindly touch 
so It is widely different from the 
unfeeling publicity of the city 
press. The offenders may be our 
neighbors, or people we have 
rubbed elbows with all our lives 
They are real human to their 
town paper, while to the great 
city dailies • they are merely 
grains of a sort that are ground 
out hourly in their news mills.

Exaggerated though they may 
be. the reports of growing dis­
sensions in Nationalist Spain be­
tween Spaniards on the one 
hand and Italians and Germans 
on the other. Indicate a develop­
ment that sooner or later seems 
bound to happen. It has been 
charged that without aid from 
Hitler and Mussolini the Insur­
gents would have suffered defeat 
long ago. On this point, it Is, of 
course. Impossible to speak with 
certainty. But to the extent the 
charge Is true It suggests that to 
an Increasing degree Franco's 
Fascists allids have sought to 
take over the direction of mili­
tary policy in Nationalist Spain 
as well as to assure themselvas 
of ultimate compensation for 
the contributions they have 
made to Franco. The extent of 
outside aid to the insurgent 
cause is revealed in the official 
Italian admission that more 
than 9.500 Blackshirts have been 
killed, wounded and taken priso­
ner in the Spanish war. Total 
German casualties remain un­
disclosed but certainly cannot 
have been negligible Thus, both 
Italy and Germany have a stake 

I In the outcome With the fight­
ing again stalemated. It Is not 
at all unlikely, therefore, that 
Hitler and Mussolini are not 
averse to drastic measures such 
as the repated bombardment of 
clvllan populations, which, they 
believe, will hasten the end of 
the war. But on the Insurgent 
fide such activities. Imperiling 
not only fellow .Spaniards, but 
in many instances families and 

j relatives of those fighting under 
Franco’s banner as well, have be- 

I gun to arouse violent protests. 
^Thes apparently have Uken the 
I form of clashes with Italian and 
, German troops. Evidence Is pll-

For July 4th
It would be a glorious Fourth 

of July If no accidents occurred 
to mar the joy of celebrating out 
one hundred and sixty-second 
anniversary of independence, de­
clared Dr Geo. W Cox. State 
Health Officer. It Is most unfor­
tunate that a day of joy and 
celebration leaves In Its wak • 
one of the sadness and sorrow In 
many homes.

It Is not alone the wounds re­
ceived from explosives that In­
crease our death toll. Injurle 
from automobile a c c i d e n t s ,  
splinters, nails, and other pene­
trating wounds In whlth dirt 
may be carried Into the skin, 
heighten the hazard of tetanus, 
or lockjaw as the disease Is com- 
mcnly called.

Tetanus is fatal In a large pro­
portion of cases. Fortunately we 
have tetanus antitoxin as a 
means of preventing the disease 
Antitoxin must be admlnUter?u 
promptly following the accident 
Treatment after the disease 
develops Is rarely succesful 
Preventive measures Include; the 
avoidance of .such wounds and 
proper medical treatment.
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Dr. Barton W. Evermann of 
the California academy of scien­
ces has found 230 species of fish 
In Texas waters. About 130 of 
them Inhabit fresh water and 100 
salt water.

TRADE AT HOME

it Is one of the most potent and
uplifting factors In our national 

! existence.—The Christian Scl-
ence Monitor.

Ing up that there U a mounting 
spirit of rebellion In Nationalist 
Spain. And this feeling of hos­
tility to foreigners who appear 
to ^  treating Spain as a con­
quered province has become all 
the more acute In view of the 
fact that the barbarous attacks 
on civilian centers has only stif­
fened the resistance of the Re­
publicans.—San Antonio Bxpre.'
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Sometimes people speak light­
ly of the country newspaper, but

press of Texas is still free It Is not compelled to print what 
the candidates hand out or slip under the door. And the news­
paper readers profit thereby.

The press of Texas and the nation is also free in that it Is 
not sub.servient to any government issued propaganda. The 
Texas Weekly estimates that every year 1.300,000 "news” stories 
are mailed to Texas newspapers from federal government 
agencies, alone. Most of this material is dreary reading. We 
suppose that occa-sionally a talented writer joins the govern­
ment’s propaganda crew, but most of the news storle.s that 
we have had the patience to read sound like the journalistic 
efforts of a country congressman’s second cousin. Certainly 
we have seen very few. If any, of these releases that a self- 
respecting country weekly would Inflict on Its readers "as is.” 

Despite the politicians’ best —or worst—efforts, the Ameri­
can press is still free.
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The San Saba Commissioners’ 
Court, with Judge J. B Harrell 
and all members present, Wed- 
ne.sday met with the Mills Coun­
ty Commissioners’ Court at Oold­
thwalte concerning the Regency 
bridge m atter. They found the 
Mills County Court favorable to 
co-operate on that matter, but 
say they have no funds available 
at thU time for the project, but 
will help when they can.

The San Saba Coun members 
then proceeded to Brownwood 
and met with Commissioners’ 
Court of that county with refer­
ence to the Northwest bridge 
matter. They found the Brown­
wood commissioners court not 
at all Interested In that project 
—a low water brldge_at North­
west and gave not the slightest 
encouragement to our commis­
sioners whatever. In co-operat­
ing with our county In the con­
struction of that bridge.

’The Rev George J Stelnman 
of the San Saba Methodist 
Church Is leaving early Monday 
morning, accompanied by sev­
eral young people of his church, 
to attend the Methodist KerrvlIIe 
Young People’s Assembly, June 
27-July 4.

Mr. and Mrs. C. E. Deese, now 
of PlantersvUle, Grimes County, 
Texas, were here Wednesday to 
dispose of their home property 
here. The residence was sold to 
W. B Taylor, local well-driller.

—News
---------- o----------

Com anche

Bill Me Craw In TypicaUBusy Day’s Campaigninsr

Probably the moit active campaigner in the hiatory 
ol Texas politics, Atty. Gen. William McCraw, now 
vunning for governor, never tniaiti an opportunity to 
add a friend to the hundred! of thousandt he alraady 
ba.«. A few momeMs from a busy candidata’i day tre 
pictured above a t AfeCraw carries hit shirt-sleava aam- 
V«-C« ior the goveraorthip W all parts of 'raaas.

J Evefi while he it getting a share. Bill McCraw is 
greeting friends. In the picturt at the left he it shak­
ing hands with N. M. Ragland, Alice farmer.

BUI McCraw la most popular with the old folks. 
Promising adaquata eld agt astiatance without tmbar* 
rttimcnt by too many regulations or too many inresti- 
gators, McCraw has tha support of tens of thousands 
of gray-hairsd Taaaaa as tM hearty hendalaap of the

old-timer in the middle photo shows.
At good at the type cates as the law cases, McCraw, 

former printer's devil who became attorney general, 
hat friends in every newspaper office in Texas. Here 
he it setting a stickful of type in the composing room 
of The Willacy County News at Raymondvilla whit*

i Publithcr D. B. Rapp looka on fratarully.

H am ilton

Mrs A. M Pagan, 87, died at 
her home In Comanche at 4:00 
o’clock Thuriday afternoon. Fun­
eral services will be held this 
morning at ten o’clock at Zion 
Hill.

Rev. R L. <Bob> Smallwood, 74 
of the Lone Oak community near 
Stephenvllle, died late Friday In 
a Stephenvllle hospital after an 
Illness of several weeks He was 
one of Erath County’s early day 
Baptist ministers.

Mrs R B Newman, 63, sister 
of O. O Brightmin of Comanche 
died In an Albuquerque. N. M 
ho-pltal June 20 from a heart 
attack following a week’s Illness.

W A (Woody) Johnston, well 
known Oustlne tiuck operator, 
and A. D. <Aaron) Pettit, Sr, 
prominent farmer and thresher 
operator of the Oustlne com­
munity, were rushed to a Gor­
man hospital at an early hour 
Monday morning as a result of 
a head-on truck and car collision 
on Highway No. 66, four miles 
east from Comanche. f

Johnston suffered a badly 
crushed hip and leg while Pettit 
was seriously cut about the head 
and fare.

Hilton Burks, secretary of the 
Comanche Chamber of Com­
merce, Dr. A. J. Gray and H. L. 
Stewart were in Austin Monday 
to Join delegations from Strawn, 
Desdemona, De Leon, Gold- 
thwaite, San Saba, Llano and 
Fredericksburg In a plea for the 
hard surfacing of Highway No. 
81 through Llano and San Saba 
Counties, the completion of unit 
one of this highway from Gold- 
thwaite to Comanche and the 
extension of the highway from 
De Leon through Strawn to Ora 
ham.

W. M. (Uncle Blllle) Bingham, 
87 died at the home of his son.

The most Important business 
transaction consummated it 
Hamilton for many months took 
place on Wednesday of this week 
when the Koen and Henderson 
Land Co., negotiated a deal be­
tween Bob Waters of Hamilton, 
Texas and Vickers and Wallace 
of Oklahoma City, by which the 
Utter named parties are obligat­
ing themselves to drill a test well 
for oil and gas on what Is known 
as the Ehiergy block assembled 
by the Koen and Henderson Land 
Co., for Bob Waters, said block 
tielng Into the Lone Star block 
near Pottsvllle and running 
north and east to the Tonkawa 
community or Warren’s creek. 
Said contractors agree to com­
mence drilling operations not 
later than July 15, 1938.

Ending a long, hopeless Inva­
lidism Thomas B Kemp, a long 
time and greatly esteemed resi­
dent of the Pottsvllle section, 
died there on Tuesday, June 15. 
He was desperately 111 at the 
time of his death of his son. Geo. 
T. Kemp, at Pottsvllle. on last 
May 4,

Dr. Robert Hughes Millwee, 
well known former Hamilton 
resident died In a Dallas hospi­
tal Wednesday morning. June 22 
at 4:00 a. m. He was 54 years 
of .age. Hl.s first wife was Alma 
Rea, daughter of the late T K 
Rea. of near Indian Gap, In 
Hamilton County

—Herald-Record

Ebony
Bv C lem entine W llm eth BrHey

Lometa
Walter Stallings passed away 

at Temple, Texas. June 16th, age 
67 years. Mr. Stallings at one 
time resided In Lometa for a 
short i>erlod and was well known 
to a number of the older resi­
dents of Lometa.

Henry Stallings of Brownwcod 
Leonard Stallings of Ballinger 
and Lucius Stephens attended 
the funeral.

Mrs. John B Sampley enter­
tained a number of her friends 
Friday morning with a luncheon 
and bridge. Her beautiful home 
was lovely with flowers taste­
fully arranged throughout. 

---------- n ----------
Bleased are the Inexperienced. 

When people get fed-up, nothing 
can give them a kick but some­
thing rotten.

! We were happy to have Bro.
IE L. Green ol Brownwood preach 
I lor us Sunday. A good c r o w d  
I attended.

Mr. and Mrs Will Crowder and 
children of Ridge attended 
church here Sunday and visited 
Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Ivy

Mrs. Eh'nest Martin and daugh­
ter, Itha, of Big Lake and MIs' 
Erma Egger attended church 
here Sunday.

Bro. Green and family visited 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs Ed­
ward Egger Sunday after ser- 

j vices.
Mr and Mrs. Austin Cawyer 

and Edna Beth went to Mercury 
Sunday to visit with Mr Caw- 
yer’s parents and his sister, Mrs. 
Loy Locker of Jacksboro who was 
heme on a visit.

Mr and Mrs. Billie McNurlln 
and children, Norvelle and Loyal 
Gene, went to San Saba Satur­
day to visit Mr. and Mrs. Pleas 
McNurlln. Sunday both fami­
lies went to Buchanan Dam. Mr. 
and Mrs. McNurlln returned 
home Sunday night. TTiey re­
port a very enjoyable trip.

Mr. and Mrs. W M. Clements 
and daughters. Ruth and Etta, 
of Indian Creek attended church 
here Sunday. After church Mr 
and Mrs. Clement were guests 
of Mr. and Mrs Ivy.

Earlene and Norma Jean Kelly, 
daughters of Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Kelly of San Angelo, are visiting 
their grandmother, Mrs. Lula 
Kelly.

Miss Ruth Ma.shburn of Indian 
Creek attended church here Sun­
day and visited Grace Briley.

Carl Lane and Burl Crowder 
are building a barn for Mrs. Nel­
lie Malone.

Mr. and Mrs. Charm Whitten- 
burg and Baby Clint had dinner 
with Mr. and Mrs. P. R. Reid 
Sunday after church.

1 Mr. and Mrs. Roy Reynolds 
¡and children spent Sunday wl'h 
1 Mrs. Reynold’s mother, Mrs. 
Meek Russell.

Arch Ketchum took his moth­
er, Mrs. J. M. Ketchum, and hU 
sisters. Miss Bessie and Miss An­

nie to San Saba where they spent 
the week end visiting relatives

Mr. and Mrs. Wood Roberts 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Charles Ro­
berts Sunday night.

Mr and Mrs H. G Duckworth 
of Mason arrived at the Wllmeth 
home Monday night. They left 
Tuesday taking their daughter, 
Mrs. Ralph Wllmeth, and Baby 
Lucy Gale with them to visit an­
other daughter, Mrs. Marshall 
Pierce, at Dallas.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles RoberU 
attended church here Sunday. 
They bro'ught the news of a new 
grandson, Loyt Aron, born Fri­
day, June 17, to Mr. and Mrs. 
Loyt Roberts.

Mr. and Mrs. George Jones re­
ceived a round trip ticket from 
their son, Hugh, In Barkley, 
California. They left Sunday of 
last week and will probably be 
gone about three weeks. Hard 
is holding down the place while 
they are gone. He says he thlnk.s 
he will get along all right if the 
store doesn’t get out of pork and 
beans.

Caradan
By Herman Reynolds

People in this vicinity are ex­
ceedingly fortunate that torren­
tial rains and floods have not 
harassed them as they have In 
other lectlcn of the country

Mrs V Horton visited with 
Mrs. Jess Stewart Sunday. Mrs. 
Horton’s husband, whe is in a 
Temple hospital. Is slightly im­
proved.

Several from this community 
attended church at Bethel Sun - i 
day.

Clayton Huckabee. employee of 
Remington Rand of Austin, 
visited home this week end. Bob 
Peterson, who Is attending the 
University of Texas accompanied 
him.

Singing was well attended 
Sunday night.

Mrs. E M. Anderson enjoyen 
an annual birthday party given 
by her children Sunday.

Doyle Horton of John Tarle- 
ton visited home this week end

TRADE AT HOME

■n
THE AWFUL PRICE YOU 

PAY FOR BEING

NERVOUS

QulvwlQf MFTM CM Mk# TO« 
h a m r d  rooltiac, c raa k y  and  hard  to  Uvo 
w ith ^ c a o  k«ap you  aw ak* a ia h u  a a d  
rob you  of good boalth , good t im aa a a 4  
joba. I

W hat you m ay  M od la a  pa rticu la r!*
iood irom aa’* looic—and  could you aa k  

9T a a r tb io g  « b o to  beneflta a ra  b>t »ac 
proTod tb a a  fam oua L ydia E. l ‘iakbam W  
V cfctablo  C om pound? Let ita who>a. 
worn* barba aa d  roota help N atu ro  bui d  
u p  moro phyaicml ro a io tan roand thuo  bolfk 
calm  your ih rioking  aorvoa. m ao mor% 
energy and  mako Ufo w orth  living agalUx 

M ore th a n  a  m illion wuo>on have to« 
ponod  boooflt—w ^  n o t le t r in k b a m 'a  
Com pound boip Y OU , too , to  go **oa»IK 
ing th ru ’* try ing  tlmoa liko H b a i  otboe 
gratefu l woman fo r tb a  paat 8  ganara« 
tiona? IT  M u s t  B E  GOOD*:

IVE A WAYv 
WITH BEARDir

Dan Bingham, at Beattie Satur­
day, June 18.

Services were held at Sand 
Hill Sunday afternoon with El­
der Short of Dp Leon officiating.
The Comanche County Old Set­

tler’s Reunion which annually 
brings together one of the largest 
crowds of the year will be held 
at Lake Eanes Thursday, July 14. 
according to an announcement 
made here this week by Judge 
R. A. Luker, president of the As­
sociation.—Chief.

WHERE DO FRECKLESgo
WHEN OTHINE IS USED?

f t 's  Amazing to Many

For nearly .30 years O lhine has 
been “phasing freckles” and 
l ig h t e n in g  su n - tan n e d  skin. 
^  here do the  freckles and tan 
go? They mildly (lake away with 
the nightly use of this dainty 
cream. Satisfy yourself, as thou­
sands do each year. The use of 
one j a r  must jdease you . . .  or 
yoiir ,nioncy will he refunded. 
Your local druggist has O thine 
. . .o r  he will gladly get il for you.

T r 1

KMner, loncer-hutlBg, 
kind to the •kin, TVeel 
Sinfle-edge Blade, are 
a n lfo ra slf  (o o d l 4' 
■nperb bladee for 104

B L A D E S
m «■ Its nissasr Mzsit

T R U T H  i i i A C n O N
Of all professions, none enjoys greater respect than 
the profession of law. It has a wonderful background 
of tradition, a rigid code of ethics, and a record ol 
splendid service to civilization.

To these fine citizens and their profession this com­
pany pays tribute. . IVe, too, hare a rigid rode of 
ethics. Good printing, in all of its forms, plays a  m a­
jor part in the e\er-accelrrating business of the mod­
em world. IVe produce printing that will be a  credit 
to the firms and individuals it represents . . . .  accu­
rately, speedily and economically.

Eagle Publishing Company
PTBLISHERS OF

T H E  G O L D T H W A IT E  EAGLE  
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C l e a r a n c e
SALE

at Drastic Redij:tions

3 Younc Mrn’s Sport Suits, 
SiiFs 35, 37, 3S -------

Z Isst jrrsr’s Curirr Sport Suits. 
S3t.5t values .. .  ___ U.95

NO AI.TKR.YT10NS .AT THKSF. PRICES

i This Store will be closed 
I Monday, in observance of 
• independence Day, July
I F'oui’th.

S P E C I A L  S A L E
We are making the followinji )>rices for Saturday, July 

1. Also for Trades Day, July o and balance of week.
Buys I.ittir Brother Overalls, pair 79c
.Men’s Sl .'i* Drev, Straw Hats $1.00 I

Î
I

l>'un; .Men's White Kelt Dres.s Hats 
^ .V , & S3.95 values $1.00

Mens White Dress Shoes and Black 
Mesh Shoes are cool ior Summer. See what 
we have and buy them at a Kood discount.

I,adies White Dress Shoes at 
Exactly o( uriginal price

ftlx99 Sheets, best quality, limit Î to person 
Each ---------  ------79c

Eyelet Embroidery and Cord Lace
Dress (iooris, values from I9c to Sl.OO 
Yard 25c

BI Y SI M.MER DRESSES 
Dresses, values up to $3.95 ... —
Dresses. $10.75 values ... _____
Dresses. $6.95 & $8.95 values
Dresses. $4.95 & $5.95 __ ____
Dresses. $3.95 values _________

YARBOROUGH’S
G O LD TH W A ITE, T E X A S  

No Charge accounts for longer than 30 days

* ■

OOLOTHWAm: E A O L Ï^üLY 1 , 1938.

Men*s Suits
3 Yount Meixs White Double Breasted Suit« 

Sites 34. 35. 37 reduced to .............$4.95

$4.95

6 Yount .Men’s Sport Suits,
Sites 35. 36. 38. 39, $19.75 values __$9.75

Students fine quality Tropical Worsted Suits 
Sites 32, 34, 37 reduced t o __ . . .  $9.75

5 Gaberdine Suits, sises 36, 37, 38. .  $14.95

8 hith trade Curlee and Montfomery' Suit» 
SZZM A 24.50 values $14.75

Sites 34. 35. 36. 39. 40. 42

Extra 1‘ants ran be had with some of these 
Suits at very reasonable prices

Monttumery Suit, site 42 stout,
$16.75 value ___  $8.95

36 inch Curtain Scrim, yard ____—. —  4c
Sheer Dress Goods, 25c value« ------ 19c
Sheer Dress Goods, 19c values, ------- 15c

Sl.OO 
. .  $4.95 

$4.95 
$3.95 

-- $2.95

¿«imilllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllHmilHIIIIMinilllHIIIIIIMIIIIHIIIHIIIIII»^li PERSONAL PARAGRAPHS
mill.................... Mini...................................................................... ..........

. . . .  _____ 11. w%it^
Mr. and Mrv E B Anderaon 

were week end visitors In Brady

WUl Burks was taken seriously 
ill Sunday night.

Jack Long was able to sit up 
awhile Tuesday

J N. Bailey, student In the 
University of Texas, spent the 
week end with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Cha.s Bailey.

Mrs. Chas Bailey visited Tues­
day with Mrs L Covington and 
daughter. Mis- Edith at Plea- 
.sant Orove.

Mrs H B Johnson has been 
quite 111 and Is confined to her 
bed. She was better at last re­
port.

Rev, Fred J Brucks Is at 
Bethel this week assisting Rev. 
O T Gibbons in a revival meet­
ing at the Mi thodlst Church

Mr. Tate from Piggly Wiggly 
and his family have returned 
from a delightful vacation at 
Corpus Christ!

Will Burk* who has been seri­
ously ill at his home here was 
repwrted much better Thursday 
morning.

Mrs. J. D McKenzie who has 
been vlslltng for the last months 
In her daughters homes In Hous­
ton and Stephenvllle has re­
turned.

Miss Ima Loi.*- Bailey left Mon­
day for Fort Worth. She has 
been on a four weeks’ vacation, 
visiting her parents, Mr. and Mrs 
Chas. Bailey.

Little Miss Nell Carmen Wil­
kins went to Au.stin last Wed­
nesday, to visit her grandparents 
and the little lady made the 
trip alone. Her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Wilkins went after her 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Allen of 
Little Rock. Ark. arrived Friday 
for a week’s visit with her sis­
ter. Mrs Walter Fairman and 
husband.

Mr. and Mrs. Hud Hamilton 
entertained a group of friends 
with a picnic supper Wednesday 
evening honoring Mr. and Mrs. 
John Shelton.

Mr. and Mrs. Emmlt Pile of 
McAllen is visiting relatives here.

CLASSIHED ADS

Norma Gene Hill Is spending 
the week with her sister, Mrs
Earl Ellis, who Is ill.

E E. Dawson and F. R. Hines 
are In South Texas on a combin­
ed business and pleasure Jaunt.

Mrs J S Bowles of Fort Worth 
came Saturday for a week’s visit 
with her mother, Mrs A. J. Gat­
lin and sisters, Miss Love and 
Mrs. Orby Woody,

CLASSIFIED AD RATES 
.One and one half cent« per 

word for first Insertion with 25c 
mlnlmom. One rent per word 
each subsequent insertion.

Notices of church entertain- 
ments where a charge of admis­
sion is made, obituaries, cards of 
thanks, reKolutions of , respect, 
and all matter not news, will be 
charged for at the regular rates.

Melbg'
OOLDt bi'

I
) Cris
j
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For Sale

Mr and Mrs Joe Doggett of 
Coleman spent the week end 
with her mother and other rela­
tives.

Mr and Mrs B L. Graham of 
Clyde are here for a visit with 
her parents. Mr. and Mrs. E L. 
Pa.ss and other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs Henry D Murphy 
and family of San Angelo arriv­
ed Monday to spend a few days 
with her parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
F. D Webb.

Tommie Moore and Bob Row­
land of Brownwood. were guests 
In L. J. Gartman’s home Sun­
day.

B R A N D  NEW nickel-plated, 
black handle Colts .45 revolver 
A beauty. Cost $35 00 My price, 
$15 00 W. H. Thompson, Brown- 
wood.

FOR SALE -80 acres good land 
74 acres to cultivate. For lease or 
sale. Might take 100 sheep In 
payment. 7 miles East of Oold- 
thwalte. Joining Chas. Welch 
Write B. F Littlepage, Mineral 
Wells. Texas. 7-l-8tc

SATli 
the net

Kenati
I
I Hrlng tta, 
|S.4T MIDV 
t the JOT,I
I Irene I
I Fiiii
i
I

n-Eii
lOVElSu
^̂ QChotTa

M iscellaneous

Mr and Mrs W C. Stewart 
and family of San Saba visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. L. J. Oartman 
Sunday.

FOR RENT—
Furnished apartment, l i v i n g  
room, bed-room, kitchen and 
private bath, also garage Room« 
nicely furnished.
Unfurnished apartment, consist­
ing of living room, bed room, 

j kitchen and private bath Also 
I a garage with this apartment. 
Both apartments available now 
If Interested .see E B Gilliam. Jr 
phones 308 or 188.

roNDDc^j
Louis

Lion$ to I 
In OaklaiA

Miss Louise Ohlenbusch from 
the Circle O Ranch, spent the 
week end with Miss Louise Gart- 
man.

Mrs L. R. Gray of Lometa 
visited her sister, Mrs. Dan 
Bush Tuesday afternoon. Mrs. 
Bush accompanied her home for 
several days visit.

Children’s sewing and smocking 
done reasonably. Cogie Roberts, 
at E. E Dawson residence.

e-10-4tc

Osklsnd, 
thouund Uu { 
their (amUia i 
the Oaklsnl ;

30c FOR OATS-We will pay SOc 
a bushel for good oats In ex­
change for subscriptions to the 
Eagle, new or renewal. Limit 10 
bushels from any one subscriber 
THE OOIJymWArTE EAGLE

Mr and Mrs David Clements 
returned Tuesday from Kings­
ville, where they spent a two 
weeks’ vacation.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Weatherby 
of Hamilton .spent a week In 
Detrlot, Mich. They returned In 
a new car and stopped Tuesday 
night with relatives here.

Mr. and Mrs. Luther O'Quln 
and .son. Marcus, of San Angelo, 
.spent the week end with her pa­
rents. Mr. and Mrs. M. E. Archer 
and other relatives.

Miss Ruby Cave returned last 
week from her vacation trip to 
New Orleans via Graham. Her 
nephew. Tommy Cave, accom­
panied her home for a month’s 
vacation.

Mrs. H. Wheeler of Rankin 
spent Friday with Mr. and Mrs. 
D. L. Wheeler. Her daughters, 
Kathleen and Norma Jean, who 
had been vi.sitlng their grandpa­
rents for .several weeks, accom­
panied her home.

D E A T H S

W . R. A dam s 
Buried June 22

lived in San Saba county at 
,Shaw Bend since he was 7 years 
of age.

W alton G atlin D ead

W. R Adams aged 88, of 
Uvalde. Texas, wa.-- buried In 

Uvalde Wednesday afternoon, j 
June 22. I

Mr Adams was an old seUierl 
X>t Mills County. He owned and j 
■operated a store in Center Cityj 
to r about twenty years, but had 
made his home In Uvalde since. 
1910. I

He Is .survived oy 14 grand- 
•chlldren and one great-grand- 
•chlld, all of whom were present 
■at his funeral

Mr. and Mrs. Ber'wyn Fulton 
« n d  Mrs. Jeff Shelton from here 
«nd  Miss Haael Fulton of Brown- 
wood attended the funeral.

---------- o----------

He was burled at Shaw Bend 
Monday afternoon at 4:30 with 
Rev. Sam Taylor of San Saba, 
conducting the sendees.

He leaves to mourn his loss 
a wife and nine children, 3 boys 
and 6 girls, also 12 grandchild­
ren.

---------- o----------

Capt and Mrs. Carl B. Mc­
Daniel. and children, Betty Jean 
and Kenneth, of Langley Field, 
Virginia arrived Thursday for a 
short visit with Capt. M. Y 
Stokes, Jr and family.

Mrs. A. J. Gatlin received the 
.sad news Sunday of the sudden 
death at his home In New York 
of her son, Walton Gatlin. He 
was burled there on Thursday. 
He is survived by his widow and 
his relatives here. Walton Is 
well remembered In Goldthwaite 
and his family have the sym­
pathy of a large circle of friends. 

---------- o----------
A ndy W. Brown  
Buried M onday

1. Q. M agee  
P asâed  A w ay

On Sunday evening about 7;00 
o’clock, the spirit of E  Q. Magee 
Of Bend, winged Its way to the 
ReaTenly home above.

Mr. Magee was a pioneer of 
San Baba county He was 70 years 
vild the day he died, and had

Andy Walter Brown. 70. form­
erly of Goldthwaite, Texas, died 
at 10:10 a m., Sunday at his 
home 7535 Canal Street, Hous­
ton. Texas He Is .survlTed by his 
widow, Mrs Cora R. Brown; 
three sons, Leslie H., George W., 
and Walter O. Brown of Hous­
ton; three brothers. Eddie E 
Brown of Houston, Andrew 
Brown of Waco and W P. Brown 
of Amarillo; and two sisters, Mrs 
H M Cryer of Houston and Mrs 
Otto Godwin of Brownwood.

Funeral services were held at 
4 p. m. Monday a t the Boulevard 
Funeral Home with the Rev. C. 
Shuttleworth officiating.

Burial was In Forest Park 
Cemetery.

Bob Bratton D ead
A mes.sage received here early 

Tuesday morning stated that R. 
M. Bratton of Fort Worth had 
pa.ssed away at his home there 
In the early morning hours.

He was a brother-in-law of 
Mrs. L. R. Conro and an old- 
time resident of Goldthwaite.

He had been In very bad 
health for several years, there­
fore his death was not unexpect­
ed.

Mrs. Conro and daughters. 
Mrs Bob Robertson and Lucille, 
left to be present at the funeral 
Wednesday morning.

The Bagle can now take youi 
.subscription to most Texas dal­
lies at bargain ratga. Ask for

Mr and Mrs. Grover Dalton 
received a message recently that 
Rev. and Mrs. Glenn Dunn have 
been transferred from Canton to 
Hongkong. China and are safe. 
They had been stationed In a dis­
trict where bombing was preva­
lent.

Arthur Parker of Odessa spent 
the week end with his brother, J. 
R. Parker his mother. Mrs. M E. 
Parker who had been visiting 
here for two weeks accompanied 
him home.

STOP THAT ITCHING
If bothered by the Itching of 

Athlete’s Foot, Eczema. Itch 
Ringworm or sore aching feet 
Hudson Bros. «111 sell you a Jar 
of Black Hawk Ointment on a 
guarantee. Prior 50c and $1 00.

8-»4-18tc
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ATTENTION lIUrSEWIVE.S
When hordes of black sugar' 

ants Invade your kitchen get 
HXl'ERMO, the guaranteed an t , 
exterminator. Extermo Is a 
honey-flavored syrup made ac­
cording to U. S. Dept, of Agrtcul-' 
ture formula and offers the 
cheapest and best method of an* 
control. A full pint lasts for 
months and coats only 39c at 
Hudson Bros. Drug Store.
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Mr. and Mrs John Edlln, Mr. 
Will Hill and daughter, Naomi, 
spent Sunday In the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. George Hill, to 
celebrate Miss Gwendolyn Hill, 
and Mrs. Edltn’s birthdays.

Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Hendrix of 
Sweetwater spent last week end 
with their son W. 8. Hendrix 
and family and her brother, E. 
L. Pass and wife and grand­
mother Pass.

Mr. and Mr.s Elarl J. Tate and 
young son from Lonoake, Texas, 
spent a part of last week here 
visiting his brother, D. D. Tate 
and family. He has been a t­
tending the Pharmaceutical 
convention In Fort Worth.

Serew w orm  M edirine . R. L. 
S teen & Son.

---------- O----------
Read the Advertisements
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I Friday & Saturday, July lit.
If You Can’t Come to Onr Store, Oar SUc»»l8

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Burns and 
daughter, Hhrplyn, her sister Mrs. 
Lambert Price and children anti 
her mother, Mrs M. A. Stephan 
of Star, spent Sunday at Bu­
chanan Dam. While there Mrs 
Price had the misfortune of fall­
ing and breaking a bone in her 
foot, which is very painful and 
she was suffering greatly at last 
report.

Catherine Fairman returned 
Tuesday from a vUlt of several 
days with Anita Lowery of 
Oatesvllle. She was accompanl- 

jed home by Anita and Dorothy 
Nell Baker, who will remain thru 

I he Fourth as Catherine’s guests.

Mrs. CurtU Peyton, a niece of 
Mrs. Lewis Hudson and daughter. 
Miss Ruth Louise of Bartlesville, 
Okla, were guests In 'the  home 
of Lewis Hudson Thursday and 
Friday. Mrs. Peyton recently 
attended a garden club festival 
at which Mrs. W. A. Shulze pre­
sented an operetta of her own 
compoaltion. Mrs. Shulze will 
be remembered here as the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. W. P. 
Weaver.

Mrs. Chts. Frizzelle went to 
Brownwood Saturday afternoon 
to meet her sister, Mrs. E. M. 
Steele and daughter. Miss Lil­
lian Ruth of San Angelo, for a 
visit with Mrs, Steele's parents, 
Mr. and Mrs P. D. Webb here.

Mr. and Mrs. R. V. Littlepage 
and her mother, Mrs. J. D. Sims, 
drove over to Uano Tuesday 
night where a Baptist revival Is 
in progress. Rev. McGuire of 
San Angeio is conducting the 
meeting and Mi. and Mrs. J. H 
Gary are In charge of the musk. 
Mrs, Gary accompanied her sla­
ter, Mrs. Littlepage. home for a 
few dajr*s visit

FRESH TOMATOES, vine ripened. $ 1*̂
NEW SPUDS, 19 lb s ................
FRESH CORN, eztra nice from the cobbUT.* 
FRESH BLACKEYEO PEAS to shell 8 
LEMONS. large size and Full O’ Juice. dM. 
FRESH GREEN BEANS. SQU.4SH. OKM. j 
Cl’Cl’MBERS, LETTUCE, CELERY, BEtn.* 
CABBAGE.
CEREAL DEAL, 2 pkgs Com Flak« 8 1

All for ......... ........................ ...........
FLOUR, Ught Crust. 24-lb sack -

P.&G.
L A U N D R Y  SO A P  
7 giant bars - 25c

OKI
Med. li^l 
Large

RAKING POWDER. Snow King, full J-» '*’' 
i AKE FLOUR, Softasilk, large package
VANILLA EXTRACT, 8 oz. bottle------
TOMATOES, No. 1 cans, 3 for ..........
MACARONI or SPAGHETTI. 3 Dozes — 
PEANUT BUTTER, Full gt. . —

M A R K E T  SPECIJ
PICNIC HAMS, rooked ready to urn, »
CHOICE VKAL STEAK, lb. _________
CHUCK ROAST, lb............. ..........'
OLD-FASHIONED FIT BARBErl’E.
You will aay "Mr. Fox makes the best ^

BRIM GR0<
H om e O w ned end

-------------
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