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NASA official suggests 
space shuttle redesign 

By LINDA BURKE 

University Daily News Reporter 

By The Associated Press 

WASHINGTON — The space 
agency's acting administrator said 
Tuesday it would cost $2.8 billion to 
replace the lost Challenger and that it 
would be "very appropriate" to 
redesign rocket boosters before any 
shuttle flies again. 

William R. Graham told a House 
committee that design modifications 
to be made in response to the Jan. 28 
explosion of Challenger will cost $350 
million, 

He also told the panel it would be 
possible to fly another shuttle in six 
months and that the National 
Aeronautics and Space Administra-
tion does not anticipate launching 
another one for at least a year. 

Even then, Graham said, NASA will 
take its time before tackling a flight 
backlog that increases with every 
passing month. There will be a wait of 
at least three months between the 
first post-accident flight and the se-
cond, and at least two months bet-
ween the second and third flights, he 
said. 

"We don't intend to increase the 
launch rate until we totally establish 
that the launch rate is safe and ap-
propriate to the system," he testified. 

The Challenger explosion came on 
the second of 15 shuttle flights the 
agency had planned this year. At 
least six commercial communica-
tions satellites had been awaiting 
launch this year. 

Asked by Rep. Bill Nelson, D-Fla., 
whether there would be a redesign of 
the way segments of the shuttle 
booster rockets are joined no matter 
the outcome of the investigation by a 
presidential commission, Graham 
replied: 

"It is my view today that it would 
be very appropriate to modify or 

station and other programs. 

Graham pledged that whatever the 
cost, the United States intends to 
maintain the capability of launching 
commercial satellites into space. 

"Yes, sir, that is exactly correct," 
Graham told Nelson, who pressed 
him on the subject. "We have been 
communicating that to our 
customers." 

In other devlopments, the Depart-
ment of Defense said it plans to limit 
the assignment of military pilots as 
astronauts to five or six years, forcing 
NASA to search for more civilian 
pilots who would not come under this 
restriction. 

redesign the field joints on the SRB's 
before we return to space flight." A 
failure of seals on one of those joints 
on Challenger's right rocket booster 
is the chief suspected cause in the ac-
cident probe. 

In his testimony before the House 
Science and Technology Committee, 
Graham stopped short of a formal re-
quest for funds to construct a new 
shuttle. 

But he said a backlog of 24 full 
cargo bay payloads would accrue by 
1990 if NASA has to operate with the 
three shuttles left in its fleet. 

"We see no cost-effective way to 
reduce that backlog should that oc-
cur," Graham said. Defense Depart-
ment requirements would take 
almost all the launch capacity, he 
said. 

Graham noted that Reagan ad-
ministration officials from several 
agencies are trying to map NASA's 
future. Officials have disclosed 
previously that the group is leaning 
toward recommending a replacement 
shuttle as well as unmanned 
throwaway rockets to boost satellites 
into space. 

One committee member, Rep. 
Manuel Lujan Jr., R-N.M., said in an 
interview that he believes the ad-
ministration eventually will settle on 
such a recommendation. He said he 
believes officials are debating 
whether to seek full financing or 
whether to have NASA absorb part of 
the replacement cost by cutting back 
on money now allocated for the space 

Duane Ross, manager of the 
astronaut selection office at the 
Johnson Space Center, said Tuesday 
that a small group of astronauts, 
about 10 to 12, will be selected this 
spring from among about 2,000 ap-
plications being reviewed. 

Another personnel officer, Teresa 
Gomez, said the flow of astronaut ap-
plications received by the National 
Aeronautics and Space Administra-
tion has increased since the 
Challenger explosion. 

Gomez said the strict military 
limitation has been under considera-
tion for some time and is not related 
to the Challenger accident. 

There are 95 astronauts in the 
corps, said Gomez. Forty-five are 
military officers who can be recalled 
to active military service, and she 
said the Department of Defense has 
served notice that all military pilots 
in the future will limited in the 
amount of time they can spend as 
astronauts. 

Ross said the agency is looking for 
civilian pilots who would not be 
limited by military restrictions. 

Election results not to be announced until Thursday 
By LAURA TETREAULT 

University Daily Nows Reporter 

The College of Arts and Sciences 
senate candidates are Garrett 
Adams, Julie Barron, Diane Bopp, 
Trey Byars, Stephen Cabrales, Kevin 
Carruth, John Cary, Randy Christian, 
Jay Craft, Arnold Galvan, Gary 
Glassman, David Gill, Jason 
Gorham, Roger Gragg, Kirt Hayes, 
Jimmie Hilton, Stacey Hopwood, 
Ross Johnson and Russell Kelley. 

Also running to represent the Col-
lege of Arts and Sciences are 
Stephanie Laird, Rick Lambert, Bill 
Lowry, Joe Lumpkin, Missy Maclure, 
Royce Medlin, Michelle Myers, Tracy 
Noack, Charles Parker, Larry Paiz, 
Kim Phelan, Ronnie Pollard, Scott 
Richardson, Kevin Roberts, Terri 
Scott, Staci Shipley, Barton Shockley, 
Ritchie Tartlet, Brian Wallach, John 
Wilkins and Shannel Woodard. 

Two Texas Tech freshmen have 
been charged with third-degree 
felonies in connection with a number 
of thefts from the architecture 
building, said Don McBeath, chief ad-
ministrator in the criminal district at-
torney's office. 

Michael Defrees and Dan Engen, 
both of 135 Sneed Hall, have been 
charged with 18 reported thefts from 
lockers on the first, third and fifth 
floors of the architecture building, 
said Gene Minnick, a University 
Police detective. 

Engen and Defrees are charged 
with taking more than $3,000 in ar-
chitecture supplies, textbooks, port-
folios and portable stereos. Minnick 
said they are charged with breaking 
into the lockers to take the property, 
most of which has been claimed. 

Minnick said police picked up a lead 
in the case when one of the two tried 
to sell some of the textbooks to the 
Red Raider Bookstore. 

The owners of the bookstore 
notified police that one of the books 
matched a book on the lost book list in 
the store. An architecture student had 
filled out a lost book card at the 
bookstore when her book was stolen. 

The stolen items were found by 
police in Engen and Defrees' dorm 
room, Minnick said. 

A third-degree felony theft charge 
is punishable by two to 10 years in jail 
and/or a maximum fine of $5,000. 

In another incident, the University 
Police will file burglary charges 
against a former Tech student by at 
the end of the week, Minnick said. The 
former student was a sophomore arts 
and sciences major. 

The suspect, described as a 22-year-
old black male, allegedly burglarized 
six cars in the C-4 commuter lot on 
March 5. A professor who saw the 
suspect lingering around the parking 
lot reported the license plate of a 1977 
Buick LeSabre to the University 
Police. 

On Monday, officer George Bailey 
saw the car in the parking lot. After 
being questioned, Minnick said, the 
suspect admitted to the burglary of 
the vehicles. 

The property recovered, which is 
valued at about $1,500, includes a 
Sony Walkman, stereo equipment, a 
gun, textbooks and backpacks, Min-
nick said. 

Minnick said the suspect was look-
ing mainly for purses. He said police 
have not been able to find any purses 
because the suspect allegedly threw 
them ,away after he took cash from 
them. 

The University Police also assisted 
in clearing several burglary cases fil-
ed with the Lubbock Police Depart-
ment and the Odessa Police Depart-
ment, Minnick said. 

The candidates for the College of 
Business Administration positions 
are Don Blevins, Len Bridgeman, 
Kreg Bryant, Kelly Cato, Stan Coats, 
Gary Dunker, Shailete Durinarn, 
Laura Enlow, Kent Farmer, Trinidad 
Galdean, Kyle Gayler, Mark Giles, 
Kathy Goldman, Gene Golembiewski, 
Christy Grimes, Jaime Hernandez, 
Michelle Meredith, Shara Michalka, 
Natalie Moore and Brett Morgan. 

Also running for the BA senate posi-
tions are Danny Neskorik, Scott Ow-
ings, Rob Parker, Brent Rice, Bryan 
Rice, Cheryl Richards, Shane Salyer, 
Kevin Schmitt, Alan Scott, Shane 
Sedate, Clay Sell, Scott Sitzes, David 
Skinner, Ben Smith, Suzanne Swain, 
Timothy Swango, Tandee Thomas, 
Mark Webb, Dory Wiley and Doug 
Woodul. 

Home Economics. 
The candidates for the College of 

Engineering senate positions are Her-
shell Allison, Mark Bruegel, Graham 
Bryant, Scott Collen, Lee Crowell, 
John Denhon, David Droese, Shellie 
Gardner, Barry Hand, Blane 
Ladymon, Len Lester, Dan Morrison, 
Darts Nevil, Denis Qualls, Janah 
Risha, Robert Romano, John Rug-
gles, Monea Steward, Thomas Stroh 
and Greg Thompson. 

Running for the College of Educa-
tion senate positions are Candy Jones, 
Rodney Markham, Michelle Petty, 
Stacey Phillips and Beth Winston. 
The candidates for the College of 
Agriculture are Brad Bass, Bruce 
Cobb, Lonnie Howard, Daniel 
Jenkins, Steve Rutherford, James 
Tidwell and Lea Weinheimer. 

running with Ben Giddings and Dena 
Wiginton for external vice president. 

The candidates for place 1 senator-
at-large are Tim Bookout, Andra 
Draper, Tom McMurray, Greg Mc-
Quitty, Ron Schwartz and Justin 
Williamson. Robert Kelley, Scott 
Pipkin and Bryan Smitherman are 
vying for place 2 senator-at-large. 
Running for place 3 senator-at-large 
are Hop Sullivan and Steven Russak. 

David Fisher, Russell Cray, T.J. 
Lubbers and Osamu Miyagawa are 
the graduate school senator can-
didates. Kevin Glasheen and Melanie 
McKenzie are the law school senator 
candidates. Kimberly Canedo, Allison 
Davis, KaLyn Laney, Tom Noeike, 
Michael Priest, Shannon Smith and 
Lisa Strangmeyer are running for the 
senate positions for the College of 

The results of today's Texas Tech 
Student Association election will not 
be processed until Thursday morning 
due to a new Lubbock County rule 
that prohibits the county computer 
processing center from being open 
past 5 p.m. 

Texas Tech students need a student 
identification card to cast their 
ballots at boxes located across 
campus. 

The candidates for SA president are 
Senators Bill Caraway and Scott 
Phelan. Senator Amy Love and Stu-
dent Liberation Movement President 
Konrad Spurting are running for the 
internal vice president post. Senators 
Linda Byars and Andy Fickman are 

District attorney candidates call for tough porn laws 
By LORRAINE BRADY 

University Daily News Reporter 

imitate crimes they see portrayed in 
the media. 

The candidates said the community 
standard regarding pornography in 
Lubbock County is much stricter than 
in other regions of the country. They 
agreed that standard must remain 
high in order to combat the criminal 
element associated with the publica-
tion and distribution of pornographic 
materials. 

Tougher laws and community stan-
dards concerning pornography are 
necessary elements to effectively 
conduct the war on organized crime, 
four candidates for Lubbock County 
Criminal District Attorney said Tues-
day night. 

The Lubbock chapter of the Na- 

tional Federation for Decency con-
ducted a panel discussion between 
Republican candidates Jim Bob 
Darnell and Travis Ware and 
Democratic candidates Wanda Wray 
and Dick Alexander in the basement 
of the Good News Bookstore, ques-
tioning the candidates about the role 
of pornography in crime. 

"The crime rate in Lubbock is go-
ing out of sight," Wray said. 

Ware cited FBI 1985 reports rank-
ing Lubbock County as the number 
one crime area in Texas. He said 
organized crime rings rate por-
nography as its third largest 
moneymaker behind drugs and 
gambling. Ware said trying more 
criminal cases and imposing tougher 
sentences for pornography law of-
fenders will deter crime. 

"I think it's time we got tough with 

criminals," Ware said. "They've 
been tough on us long enough." 

The candidates agreed that por-
nography itself is not a cause but does 
contribute to violent crimes. "Stamp-
ing out pornography is not going to 
stamp out rapes and murders, but it 
will eleminate some," Alexander 
said. 

Darnell said he thinks people with 
aggressive, violent natures tend to 

Cavazos appoints Haragan to permanent vice presidential post 
By JAY MILLER 

University Daily News Reponer 

and has mentioned it as one of his 
priority goals. I would be most disap-
pointed if he didn't continue to work 
for a solution." 

ed him the high regard of both faculty 
and administrators." 

Both Cavazos and Wilson said 
Haragan's appointment will prove 
beneficial in resolving the longstan-
ding dispute between Tech ad-
ministration and faculty concerning 
the controversial tenure policy. 

"Since Haragan comes from within 
our faculty, I know he has a fair 
understanding of the problem, and his 
appointment will certainly accelerate 
the process to resolve the problem," 
Cavazos said. 

"I sincerely hope he (Haragan) will 
continue to work to resolve the pro-
blem," Wilsbn said. "He has already 
done much to work toward a solution 

Cavazos said faculty input was im-
portant in his selection of Haragan, 
while Wilson asserted that faculty in-
put was so minimal it could not have 
weighed heavily. 

"I don't think faculty input weighed 
heavily in the selection, because there 
were not that many faculty members 
who chose to participate in the pro-
cess," Wilson said. "I do know that 
every letter submitted by faculty was 
read aloud and discussed at the 
search committee meetings." 

search nationwide for a permanent 
replacement. Haragan announced 
early last fall that he was one of the 88 
candidates being considered for the 
post. 

After assessing the applications 
and resumes of the 88 candidates, the 
search committee announced in 
December that the field had been nar-
rowed to four. 

The other three finalists in the 
search were Dr. Charles Jennett, 
dean, College of Engineering, Clem-
son University; Dr. Roland Haden, 
dean, College of Engineering and Ap-
plied Sciences, Arizona State Univer-
sity; and Marvin Barker, dean, Col-
lege of Arts and Sciences, University 

A seven-month search for a perma-
nent vice president for academic af-
fairs and research ended Tuesday 
when Texas Tech President Lauro 
Cavazos appointed Donald Haragan 
to the post. 

Haragan had served as interim vice 
president since Aug. 5, 1985, after 
John Darling resigned over what he 
called policy disagreements and a 
lack of faculty support for Cavazos. 

Following Darling's resignation, 
Cavazos appointed a 13-member 
search committee, chaired by Home 
Economics Dean Elizabeth Haley, to 

of Missouri-Rolla. 
Each of the finalists visited with 

Tech administration and faculty dur-
ing interviews scheduled in 
February, with Tech faculty 
members being encouraged to con-
tribute to the selection process. 
Faculty attendance at the four 
question-and-answer sessions with 
the candidates was "poor," according 
to Faculty Senate President 
Margaret Wilson. 

"While each of the four final can-
didates in this search has excellent 
qualifications," Cavazos said, 
"Haragan's special leadership 
abilities made him eminently well-
suited for the position and have gain- Donald Haragan 



Survival kits 
make bucks, 
not easier life 

University Daily 
Staff Writer 

Scott 
Faris 

My parents recently received mail 
from Student Survival Services, an 
organization based in College Station. 
The official letter described the useful 
service fulfilled by the organization: 
providing final exam survival kits to 
students for only $11.75. 

"Our goal is to help your student 
survive final exams," said a small 
pamphlet accompanying the letter. It 
sounds more like a scheme to turn a 
quick buck. 

What a great idea. Throughout life 
people are always preparing "kits" to 
aid us along the way. 

In elementary school, mommy and 
daddy bought our school supplies — a 
pencil, one of those neat arrowhead or 
spaceship shaped erasers, Big Indian 
Chief writing pads and a school box to 
contain it all, which probably was 
recycled from an old cigar box. 

In junior high, dating was on the 
scene, forcing mommy and daddy, 
now called mom and dad, to buy us 
"cool" clothes and shell out bucks to 
cover movies and rollerskating. 

Once high school arrived, we were 
in the big time. Cars hit the "essen-
tials for survival" list. 

Now that college is upon us, mom 
and dad still may be shelling out cash 
to cover tuition and dorm or apart-
ment rental. Why not give us a final 
exam survival kit too? 

The "survival" kit includes many 
obviously important study aids: a hot 
drink mug, candy, a "Do Not 
Disturb" sign and yes, even "Slim 
Jim Beef Sticks." 

The organization also will provide a 
sure-fire tension reliever upon guar-
dian approval: an official finals pun-
ching balloon. I think they must have 
it authorized in case the student is 
non-violent. 

I suspect the organization is run by 
a few intelligent students who think 
they easily can separate parents from 
their cash. If parents are gullible 
enough to buy it, they deserve to lose 
their money. 

Maybe some brilliant individual 
will devise a post-graduation survival 
kit. $25,000 and a Porsche come to 
mind quickly. 

Everybody should design and 
market a kit of their own. After all, it 
serves as a perfect vehicle to make a 
quick dollar or two. People always 
are willing to waste money on useless 
things. 

"We want agreements that truly 
diminish the nuclear danger. We want 
real agreements, agreements that 
really work, with no cheating." 

If Ronald Reagan really meant 
those words in his speech on military 
spending, why has he turned his back 
on the single best opportunity 
available to the superpowers for an 
agreement "that really works, with 
no cheating?" 

That opportunity lies in a joint 
moratorium on nuclear testing, which 
might well lead on to a Comprehen-
sive Test-Ban Treaty (CBT). Reagan 
is the first president to evince no in-
terest whatever in either a 
moratorium or a treaty. 

That is not because, as he and his 
administration once insisted, neither 
could be adequately verified. Mikhail 
Gorbachev, the Soviet leader, has ex-
plicitly agreed to both on-site inspec-
tion and whatever "achievements of 
seismology" may be useful for 
verification purposes; actually, as far 
back as the Carter administration's 
negotiations for a (2'I'13, the Soviets 
had agreed in priciple to on-site 
inspections. 

Nor does Mr. Reagan's steadfast 
opposition to a test-ban derived, as his 
administration now instists, from a 
need for periodic proof-testing to 
make sure nuclear weapons in the 
stockpile still work. That's only an ex-
cuse because such tests have seldom 
been conducted in the past; and 
qualified scientists say weapons 
reliability can be adequately checked 
by other means. 
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	viewpoint 
Weeding 'em out 
Teachers should not fear examinations 

prehensive, and even scared, to take 
the test. Looking over a copy of study 
material will tell any college-
educated individual that the test is no 
more than a basic test of academic 
terms and procedures. What is so 
frightening about being required to 
have a working knowledge of one's 
profession? 

The educators who are proficient in 
their field probably had no problems 
with the test. Those are not the ones 
the test was aimed at. The iincompe-
tent teachers — the ones who cannot 
comprehend a simple reading 
passage — are the ones who need to 
be banned from the classroom. 

Teacher competency tests probably 
won't cure the ills of the public school 
system, but at least it's a place to 
start. It's true that the test will not be 
able to evaluate a science teacher 
compared to an English teacher, but 
it will at least standardize the work-
ing knowledge of educators and ad-
ministrators statewide. Universities 
should be a place to start eliminating 
incompetent teachers, but with the 
expected TECAT failure rate, they 
obviously are not. 

The number of education majors 
who attend college to find husbands or 
want to work in a profession that of-
fers three months of vacation is ap-
palling. How many people on this 
campus would you want to educate 
your children? How many education 
majors would you be willing to let 
educate them? 

There is not enough importance 
placed on the education system of this 
country, and that is why we continual-
ly produce mediocre teachers. 
Teacher salaries, which traditionally 
have been low, do not attract top 
minds when other fields have more to 
offer. Only when teachers can prove 
themselves worthy of the positions 
they hold can they expect the respect 
and monetary rewards they deserve. 
Educators need to quit complaining 
about tests and should lobby for more 
opportunities to demonstrate their 
teaching abilities. 

Teachers hold a unique position in 
the development of young minds and 
should realize the great responsibility 
they have in the ulitmate develop-
ment of this nation. 

University Daily 
Staff Writer 

Lorraine 
Brady 

School children around the state 
had the day off Monday as their 
teachers submitted to taking the con-
troversial teacher competency test. 
Although students did not mind a 
brief vacation, some teachers were 
not too thrilled with the day's task. 

All Texas public school teachers 
and administrators currently 
employed by a learning institution 
were required to take the test to 
secure their positions as educators in 
this state. The majority of Texas 
teachers strongly opposed the test. 
But unlike other tests, this particuliar 
exam could turn out to be one of the 
most important recent education 
reforms for the state. 

The competency test, which was 
adopted by a special session of the 
1984 Legislature, examined about 
210,000 educators around the state for 
basic literacy and comprehension 
skills. The test was aimed at weeding 
out incompetent teachers. Teachers 
who are opposed to the test argue that 
four years of college, certification by 
the state and performance in the 
classroom should be enough ex-
perience to secure their jobs. 

Obviously, even that much is not 
enough, however, as an estimated 
10,000 teachers will have failed the 
test. That is not an encouraging 
number. One of those educators easi-
ly could have been an instructor you 
had during your career in the Texas 
public school system. 

Teachers complain about the test. 
But should they? Taxpayers have the 
right to request, even demand, com-
petent educators in the public school 
system. After all, along with the 
Texas Examination of Current Ad-
ministrators and Teachers (TECAT) 
came a 40 percent pay raise for begin-
ning teachers and the richest teacher 
merit pay plan in the country. 

It seems that educators should be 
more than willing to take the test to 
prove they are qualified to shape the 
minds of this country's youth. But the 
majority of teachers have been ap- 

Reagan misleading the public 
want "agreements that truly 
diminish the nuclear danger." A test 
ban, toward which a successful joint 
moratorium would be an important 
step, would diminish that danger 
perhaps more than any other feasible 
agreement; it would do so by making 
the development of new nuclear 
weapons far more difficult, if not 
impossible. 

Precisely for that reason, Ronald 
Reagan does not want a test ban. He 
wants, for one specific thing, to con-
tinue the kind of underground nuclear 
explosions that he hopes will lead to 
the perfecting of and X-ray laser. 
Such lasers would be a vital compo-
nent of Mr. Reagan's proposed space-
based defense, which he persists in 
falsely labeling "non-nuclear." 

He wants also to continue the 
development of new and more effec-
tive nuclear weapons because, as he 
has just told the nation again, he 
believes the Soviets maintain 
military including nuclear superiorty 
over the U.S. There's no credible 
evidence to support that assertion, 
but Mr. Reagan has never been one to 
rely on evidence. 

The House, however, may well rely 
on the strong evidence demonstrating 
that Mr. Reagan does not want a real 
agreement "with no cheating" to ban 
nuclear tests. The chairman of its 
Foreign Affairs and Armed Services 
committees, together with 208 other 
members, are sponsoring a measure 
calling for a resumption of test-ban 
negotiations with the Soviets. The 
Senate already has passed such a 
resolution. Mr. Reagan, needless to 
say, is opposed. 

New York Times News Service 

Doonesbury 

So They Say . . . 
"Nothing out of its place is good and nothing in its place is 

bad." 

—Walt Whitman By Berke Breathed 

The administration further insists 
that worries about weapons reliabili-
ty undermine deterrence on both 
sides, perhaps making it likelier that 
one or both superpowers would use 
nuclear weapons while sure that they 
would work. That's just another ex-
cuse for continued testing, because if 
either Moscow or Washington acted 
on such flimsy reasoning, it would 
face certain nuclear retaliation. 

Actually, in the unlikely event that 
nuclear weapons reliability becomes 
a real concern, the uncertainty would 
affect both super powers, probably 
making both less likely to use them. 

The administration certainly can't 
argue that a test ban can't be worked 
out with the Soviets. Mr. Gorbachev 
proposed a six-month test mortorium 
last summer and Moscow has pur-
sued it ever since. Ronald Reagan re-
jected it out of hand. In his Jan. 15 call 
for disarmament, Mr. Gorbachev 
devoted about a quarter of his state-
ment to the issue and extended his 
unilateral moratorium three months 
to March 31, with a further invitation 
for the U.S. to join. Mr. Reagan did 
not respond. 

Such a moratorium cannot be con-
sidered a danger to U.S. security. If 
the Soviets were to cheat, that would 
be known immediatlely; in that case, 
or if Moscow openly broke the agree-
ment, the U.S. could immediately 
resume its own tests, with little scien-
tific or military loss. 

It's even a violation of Mr. 
Reagan's legal responsibilities for 
him to refuse to discuss a moratorium 
or a CBT with the Soviets. In both the 
Limited Test-Ban Treaty of 1963 and 
the Nuclear Non-Proliferation Treaty 
of 1968, the U.S. is solemnly pledged 
to work and negotiate for an end to all 
nuclear tests for all time. 

That's why it's necessary to ques 
tion whether Mr. Reagan told the na-
tion the truth when he claimed to 

LETTERS 

To the editor: 
This letter concerns misleading 

propaganda on campus which is 
sponsored by the College 
Republicans of Texas Tech. The 
poster, picturing an underprivileg-
ed little girl, tells of Sandinista 
atrocities such as raping, burning 
homes, torturing and destroying 
crops. 

There is no evidence of such 
human rights violations by the San-
dinista government. There is, 
however, much evidence of human 
rights violations by the 
U.S.-supported Contras. The suc-
cess of the social programs im-
plemented by the Sandinistas also 
have been widely recognized. 

The Nicaraguan policy of the 
Reagan administration is based on 
misinformation and outright lies. 
Concerned students should in-
vestigate the issue and make their 
opinions felt in Congress. 

—Tanya Hemphill 
Philip A. Dennis 

Bloom County By Garry Trudeau 

Int 
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Reagan won't surrender aid bill 
By The Associated Press 

WASHINGTON — President 
Reagan conceded Tuesday the 
American people have serious doubts 
about giving $100 million to 
Nicaraguan guerrillas, but said he 
would reject any effort to water down 
the aid proposal by "temporizing and 
quibbles." 

"To delay or reduce the aid we have 
requested for the freedom fighters 
could be to send too little too late," 
Reagan told out-of-town reporters in a 
question-and-answer session at the 
White House. 

"We haven't completed the job of 
letting the American people know all 
the facts," Reagan said. This is one of 
the reasons, the president said, why 
he plans to make a nationally broad-
cast speech on the issue Sunday night, 
three days before a vote by the House 
of Representatives is tentatively 
scheduled. 

defensive needs," he said. "They 
must not compromise Latin 
America's democracies or our own 
southern borders. They must not com-
promise freedom." 

Asked whether the American public 
had fallen in line behind his program, 
Reagan said, "No, they haven't, and 
our own polls indicate there is a great 
feeling of people saying, 'What are we 
doing in that little country?"' 

An ABC News poll released last Fri-
day showed that three-fifths of 
Americans believe Congress should 
reject Reagan's request. 

"In the last few days here in 
Washington there has been talk of 
compromise on this issue: smaller 
amounts of aid, delay in providing it, 
restrictions on the uses to which it 
could be put, all the usual temporizing 
and quibbles," Reagan said. 

The president was asked specifical-
ly about a compromise plan, sug-
gested by Sen. James Sasser, D-
Tenn., calling for Congress to ap- 

"Those who would compromise 
must not compromise the freedom 
fighters' lives nor their immediate 

Fifty-nine percent of the 543 people 
surveyed by telephone said Congress 
should say no to the $100 million aid 
package, while 34 percent supported 
it. 

prove the aid but withhhold any of it 
for six months as an inducement to 
Nicaragua's Marxist-led government 
to negotiate for peace. 

"I will listen to any proposal that 
anyone wants to make that is tied to 
the idea of letting us come to the aid of 
these Contras, but the only proposal 
of that kind that I have heard was one 
that involved a long period of time 
and then was not a sure thing, but 
they would then vote again to see 
whether we could have the money and 
use it," he said. "I don't think that 
would be a compromise that I could 
listen to at all." 

The Sasser proposal calls for the 
president to report to Congress if he 
considers the negotiations efforts un-
successful. Congress would have to 
take a vote agreeing to his statement 
before the funds could be spent. 

Aquino orders arrest of Marcos legislators 
By The Associated Press 

MANILA, Philippines — President 
Corazon Aquino's government issued 
arrest orders Tuesday for two Marcos 
legislators, now in hiding, who are ac-
cused of killing her supporters before 
and after the Feb. 7 election. 

A government news release said 
Defense Minister Juan Ponce Enrile 
ordered the arrests of National 
Assemblymen Arturo Pacificador, an 
assistant majority leader, and Orlan-
do Dulay. Both went underground 

Pacificador in the 1984 National 
Assembly election. 

Prosecutors had recommended ac-
tion against Pacificador while Mar-
cos still was in power, but nothing was 
done. 

minority. The Philippines also is 
plagued by a communist insurgency, 
ill which Aquino says she will try to 
acnieve a cease-fire. 
• An official U.S. team arrived to 
spend a week assessing the Aquino 
government's needs in U.S. military 
and economic aid. 

Pacificador is wanted in the Feb. 11 
assassination of Evelio Javier, 
Aquino's campaign chairman in the 
central Philippine province of Anti-
que, and also faces murder charges in 
the deaths of seven of Javier's 
followers. Javier ran against 

Dulay is sought in a series of kill-
ings and kidnappings of Aquino's 
followers in the northern province of 
Quirino. 

Some of Aquino's advisers want her 
to proclaim a revolutionary govern-
ment to make it easier to reform the 
system Marcos left behind. 

when former President Ferdinand E. 
Marcos, who had ruled for 20 years, 
fled to Hawaii on Feb. 26 with his 
family and retinue. 

In other developments: 
• Aquino scheduled her first full 
Cabinet meeting for today. On the 
agenda is a proposal to proclaim a 
revolutionary government and 
dissolve the National Assembly, in 
which Marcos' New Society Move-
ment holds two-thirds of the seats. 
• Exiled leaders of a Moslem 
separatist rebellion returned to 
negotiate autonomy for the Moslem 

NEWS BRIEFS 
Soviet Union may form space station 
SPACE CENTER, Houston (AP) — The Soviet Union may be preparing 

as early as this week to link up three large craft already in orbit and then 
launch a trio of cosmonauts to inspect and activate a large space station, 
an American expert on the Russian space program said Tuesday. 

James Oberg, a space engineer and author who closely monitors the 
Soviet space program, said three unmanned Russian craft launched 
earlier have now drifted to within four miles of each other and he expects 
that they soon will be linked to form a large space station. 

Oberg said the Salyut 7 space station, which was launched in 1982 and 
has been manned for long periods of time, is already linked to a craft call-
ed Cosmos 1686, which was launched last fall. 

The dual craft, he said, have drifted into a closely parallel orbit now 
with the Mir, a large Salyut-type craft that the Soviets have said will form 
the core of a new space station. The Mir was launched Feb. 20. 

Government wants few Soviets in U.N. 
MOSCOW (AP) — The Kremlin countered a U.S. order to cut Soviet 

staff at the United Nations with an official protest Tuesday warning 
Washington that its "illegitimate demand" could jeopardize U.S.-Soviet 
relations and the next summit. 

The official news agency Tass distributed a text of Moscow's protest to 
the United States. Parts of it were read on Radio Moscow. 

The protest accuses the United States of violating international 
agreements on the United Nations, headquartered in New York, and 
denies U.S. accusations that spies are among the Soviets' 275 U.N. 
employees. 

Foreign Ministry officials called the U.S. Embassy Tuesday morning 
and asked for a meeting, where the oral protest was delivered to Charge 
d'Affaires Richard Combs, according to embassy spokesman Mark 
Smith. 

The U.S. government on Friday ordered the Soviet Union to cut its U.N. 
staff to 170 over the next two years, a 38 percent reduction. The order 
termed the number of Soviet staff "unreasonably high" and said it poses 
"a threat to U.S. national security." 

Tornadoes damage Midwestern states 
CINCINNATI (AP) — Wreckage littered parts of Kentucky, Ohio and 

Indiana and National Guardsmen patrolled against looters Tuesday after 
a barrage of tornadoes and high wind killed six people, injured more than 
100 and caused damage estimated at more than $20 million. 

Utility crews worked to restore power after up to 70,000 customers were 
blacked out in the three states, though most were back in service 
Tuesday. 

Some roads remained blocked by debris, states of emergency were 
declared in two Kentucky cities, and the governors of Kentucky and In-
diana set out to survey damage from the tornadoes that struck late 
Monday. 

At least three people were charged with looting in Covington, Ky. 
A survey of the hangar area Tuesday found 24 aircraft were damaged, 

14 of them beyond repair, down from earlier estimates, airport 
spokesman Ted Bushelman said. Most of the damaged airplanes were 
small. The airport was closed for two hours while debris was cleared and 
Tuesday's commercial flights went on as scheduled. 

Indiana's tornado season usually doesn't begin until about March 20, 
the day targeted this year as tornado awareness day, said weather ser-
vice meteorologist John T. Curran at Indianapolis. 
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STRAPS 
The Student Texas Recreation and Park 

Society will meet at 6 p.m. today in 209 UC. New 
director Lee Osborn will speak. 

VHETAT 
Officer application forms for the Vocational 

Home Economics Teachers Association of 
Texas can be picked up in 263 home economics 
building until Friday. Applications are due 
March 25. 

PASS 
Programs for Academic Support Services 

will have a workshop on "Developing Math 
Study Skills" at 4 p.m. today and a study skills 
group on study skills and time management at 7 
p.m. today in 42B administration building. 

FASHION BOARD 
The Fashion Board will have an executive 

meeting at 6 p.m. today and a general meeting 
at 6:30 p.m. today in 76 Holden Hall. 

RED RAIDER CLUB 
The Red Raider Club faculty/staff member-

ship drive scheduled for 11:45 a.m. to 1:15 a.m. 
today has been canceled. 

BETA ALPHA PSI 
Beta Alpha Psi will have a professional 

meeting and regional presentations at 7 p.m. to-
day in the UC. 

ACE 
The Association of Childhood Education will 

present music by Mary Ann Vaughn at 6:30 
p.m. Thursday in 235 administration/education 
building. All members should attend. 
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ApplicATioNs FOR 

UD ADVERTISING STAFF 
POSITIONS 
ARE AVAILABLE IN 

102 JOURNALISM Bldq. 
Now Thuough MARCH 14 

Interviews will be held March 24—March 28 
for the following University Daily Advertising 

Staff Positions: 

DISPLAY ADVERTISING STAFF (Summer -4 Positions; Fall-12 Positions) 

The position involves layout and design of advertising plus sales and 
service of local advertising accounts. 20-hour week. Commission Only. 

CLASSIFIED DISPLAY STAFF (Fall-1 Position) 

The position involves layout and design of display ads for the Classified 
Section of the U.D. Person is also responsible for promotional fillers and 
special classified promotions. 20-hour week. Hourly salary. 

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING STAFF (Summer-1 Position; Fall-2 Positions) 

The position involves inside sales for Classified Section of the UD. 
Student works with computer system and as staff receptionist. Typing 
skills helpful. Need one student with morning work hours available; one 
student with afternoon work hours available. 20-hour week. Hourly salary. 

FRESHMAN DIRECTORY ADVERTISING STAFF (Summer-1 Position) 

The position involves design, layout and selling of advertising for special 
Tech publication. June-August. 20-hour week. Commission Only. 

UD COUPON SECTION (Summer-2 Positions) 

The position involves design, layout and selling of advertising for this 
Back-To-School UD Section. June-August. 20-hour week. Commission 
Only. 

All majors are welcome as UD Advertising Staff applicants. 

There are no course requirements. Only one afternoon lab is 

allowed per week. 
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CAMPUS BRIEFS Padre prepares for students 
By CHERYLE LOCKE 
University Daily News Reporter 

Philosophy professor presents lecture 
"Spinoza: The God Intoxicated Atheist" will be the topic of a free public 

lecture given by philosophy professor Jonathan Bennett of Syracuse 
Univerity. The lecture is at 8 p.m. today in the room 101 biology building. 

Spinoza is considered one of the most important philosophers of the 
modern era, according to Philosophy Chairperson Daniel 0. Nathan. 

The lecture is free to the public. 

Easter egg exhibit to be presented today 
The native art forms of Ukrainian embroidery and the painting of Easter 

eggs will be demonstrated from 7 to 8 p.m. today in the Qualia Room of the 
foreign language building. 

The demonstration is presented by Irene Kmetyk, a native of the 
Ukraine, and sponsored by the Texas Tech department of Germanic and 
Slavic languages. 

Costumes, embroidery and pysanka will be exhibited in the Tech library 
today and Thursday. 

The demonstrations are open and free to the public. For more informa-
tion contact Slavic languages professor W.T. Zyla at 742-3286. 

Tech establishes Alzheimer's Center 
Vernon and Elizabeth Haggerton of Lubbock have presented a $52,000 

check to establish the Texas Tech Alzheimer's Center to Dr. J. Thomas 
Hutton, who directs the center, and Dr. J. Ted Hartman, dean of the Texas 
Tech University School of Medicine. 

MOMENT'S NOTICE 

Students are not the only ones who 
foam at the mouth with the anticipa-
tion of spring break. 

Resort city cops and entrepreneurs 
begin dreaming of dollar signs with 
excitement while there still is snow on 
the ground. 

College students who have plans to 
hang out at South Padre for the 
week's vacation need to be prepared 
to mind the rules. Fern Askew, a 
spokeswoman for the South Padre 
Chamber of Commerce, said students 
should not neglect even simple laws 
such as wearing seat belts and driv-
ing the specified speed limit. 

"Pay attention, and when it says go 
30, go 30 and wear your selt belt," 
Askew said. "I hate to see students 
get down here and get in trouble and 
spend their money on things they had 
not intended to. 

"They (the students) are not going 
to get off just because they are 
students down here partying." 

Askew said not only do law officers 
crack down on students during spring 
break, but hotel and motel owners 
seize the opportunity as well. 

Askew said there is not a hotel or 
motel owner who does not require a 
deposit to cover damages. If things in 
the room are not left in perfect condi-
tion, students can plan on losing every 
cent of their deposit, she said. 

Those students planning to leave 
the country for spring break need to 
take precautions about the regula-
tions concerning what can and cannot 

Basketball teams 
prepare to depart 
for NCAA games 
The Texas Tech men's basket-

ball team was scheduled to leave 
for Dayton, Ohio, at 7 a.m. today 
for the first round of the NCAA 
basketball tournament. 

The Raiders will face the 14th-
ranked Georgetown Hoyas in 
Georgetown's eighth concecutive 
appearance in the NCAA tourna-
ment. The game will be shown at 6 
p.m. Thursday, Lubbock time, on 
KCBD-TV, Channel 11. 

If the Raiders win, they will not 
return to Lubbock until 2:20 p.m. 
Sunday. If they lose, they will 
return home Friday. 

The Tech women's basketball 
team will leave at 4:55 p.m. today 
for Long Beach, Calif., for the first 
round of the women's NCAA tour-
nament. The Raiders will face 
Long Beach State (284) at 9:30 
p.m. Saturday, Lubbock time. The 
game will air at 9:25 p.m. on 
KFYO-AM radio, 790 on the dial. 

If the Lady Raiders win, they 
will not come back to Lubbock un-
til after spring break because they 
will go on to regional play, also at 
Long Beach. If they lose, they will 
return to Lubbock Sunday. 

The Saddle Tramps will be sell-
ing Texas Tech basketball pins for 
$1.50 each in the University Center 
from 8 a.m. to 4 p.m. today. 

be taken across the border. 
Will Morris of the diversion control 

department of the Drug Enforcement 
Agency in Dallas said students should 
take special precautions before tak-
ing prescription drugs into Mexico or 
other countries. 

"If you've got prescription drugs, 

declare them to customs, especially if 
they are controlled drugs," he said. 
"They (the drugs) must be in a 
prescription container with your 
name on it. As far as trying to give 
your medicine to someone over there 
(across the border) or trying to bring 
some back with you from over there, 
well, that's a no no." 

Controlled drugs include narcotics, 
amphetimines, cough syrup with co-
deine and a few other prescription 
drugs, Morris said. 
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Entertainment outlook slows 
during spring break weekend 
By ERIC STEELE 
University Daily Lifestyles Reporter 

Good guys, bad guys 

Clint Eastwood, Eli Wallach and Lee Van Cleef 
star in the 1 967 western, "The Good, the Bad 
and the Ugly." The movie was directed by 
Sergio Leone. It will be shown at 8 p.m. today 

in the Allen Theater. Tickets for students can be 
purchased for $ 1.50 at the University Center 
ticket booth. The western runs 167 minutes 
and has no rating. 

HUB CITY 

HAPPENINGS 

Dale Lynch will host the rock 'n' 
roll jam tonight at Ground Zero: The 
Wherehouse for a $2.25 cover. Bentley 
James and friends will play rock 'n' 
roll Thursday night for a $3.25 cover. 

Hard rock band Black Page will 
play the Wherehouse Friday night. 
Cover is $3.25. Anthony Poe runs his 
new music show, DNA: Situation 2, 
after hours Friday and all night 
Saturday (10 p.m.-4 a.m.). Cover 
Saturday night is $3.25. 

Also scheduled at the Wherehouse: 
Boycott, March 21 ($4.25) and 
Mindless Dust, March 22 ($3.25). 

Bourbon Street's Lower Quarter, 
located at Fourth and Slide, has been 
featuring live jazz on weekends for a 
month or so. Main Frame will per-
form Friday and Saturday nights at 
the Lower Quarter for a $3 cover. 

Start looking for the Lower 
Quarter's bookings to appear regular-
ly in Hub City Happenings. 

Clint Eastwood stars in the cowboy 
classic "The Good, the Bad and the 
Ugly" tonight in the Allen Theater. 
Eastwood makes Indiana Jones look 
like a wimp in this one. Check it out. 
Tickets cost $1.50 for students. 
Showtime is 8 p.m. 

ED 
Loose Ends: 
Peaches is out; Club 100 is in. 

Peaches gave way to Lubbock's 
original new music establishment, 
Club 100, last week. There are plans, 
however, to relocate Peaches. 

Club 100 was occupying the Peaches 
location on Thursday nights until the 
closure of Peaches. Club 100 will be 
open Thursday, Friday and Saturday 
nights from 7 p.m. until 2 a.m. The 
club may open full-time depending on 
its success and the response of the 
public. 

There will be three disc jockeys 
featured at Club 100: Steve Anthony, 
Chris Halco and Greg Scott. 

Not much going down this week in 
Lubbock. All the local entertainment 
businesses, see, figure that the ma-
jority of y'all are cruisin' town Fri-
day, so they're saving all the good 
stuff for when we get back. 

I mean, why book Van Halen when 
no one's going be here to see them? 

Not all is lost for the pitiful few who 
are stuck in town, however. Austin-
based Marcia Ball will be playing her 
roadhouse blues music Friday and 
Saturday nights at Fat Dawg's. Ball 
is supposed to be a hot item on the 
Austin night scene. Anyway, cover is 
$4 both nights. 

Fat Dawg's is featuring Sing-A-
Long nights on Wednesdays. They put 
pitchers on sale for a couple of hours 
and then, once everyone's in the mood 
and all, they break out the song book 
and everyone sings tunes all night. A 
piano guy is there to make sure 
everyone stays on key, but it rarely 
helps. There is no cover for the Sing-
A-Long. 

StudENT.  ASSOCIATION UpdArE 

A responsibility of the University Life Committee 
is public relations with the student body. We 
hope that this senate update helps to better 
inform you, the student, of some of our current 
activities. Thank you for your support this year 
and please continue your input with next year's 
representatives. 

K 

LINDA BYARS 
UNIVERSITY LIFE CHAIRPERSON 

Cindi Barela 
External Vice President 

Alison Bennett 
Internal Vice President 

Lin Carter 
SA President 

Intergovernmental Relations Committee 
Chairman: Stephanie Laird 
Vice Chairman: David Hill 

Alumni Relations Committee 
Chairman: Allison Davis 

Vice Chairman: Russell Gray 
The Alumni Relations Committee members are 
trying to improve communications between 
students and student senate alumnae. They are 
involved in the High School Government Lead-
ership Conference to further the leadership 
abilities of high school juniors and to give them 
an idea of what to expect in college. Also, they 
are checking into the feasibility of a Shadow 
Program to let students observe someone who 
is working in their expected field to help them 
decide if he/she is in the right major. 

Texxans 
President: Shane Sedate 

Coordinator: Cynda Walker 

Rules & Administrations Committee 
Chairman: David Fisher 

Vice Chairman: Amy Love 

The Rules & Administrations Committee is involved in 
the task of defining who has full rights to the floor of 
the Senate. They also supervise the Election Commis-
sion to insure that the SA General Elections run fairly 
and efficiently. They have succeeded in adding an 
ex-officio (non-voting) member to the student senate 
and now have a representative to the faculty. 

The Intergovernmental Relations 
Committee has been successful in 
the attempt to hold the Texas State 
Student Association Convention at 
Tech this year. This important event 
will be used to inform student 
leaders of important political issues 
and to represent Tech as an innova-
tive university. 

Texxans, a support group of the 

Senate under the supervision of 

the University Life Committee, 

have been active in public rela-

tion activities and are looking 

into a student advocate service. 

Freshman Council 
President: Stacy Hopwood 

Sponsors: Kelly Cato & Andy Fickman 

The Freshman Council had a car 

wash fundraiser and are in charge of 

Freshman Who's Who. 

Budget & Finance Committee 
Chairman: Jim Bridgeman 

Vice Chairman: Hop Sullivan 

The Budget & Finance Commit-
tee has been involved in the 
extensive job of funding student 
organizations through an inter-
view and budget proposal pro-
cess. 

Student Services Committee 
Chairman: Bill Carraway 

Vice Chairman: Scott Phelan 

The Student Services Committee is 
attempting to create a student 
endowment fund for scholarships. 
They have currently distributed a 
survey of Tech students to determine 
what student services are needed 
and/or desired. And, they are attemp-
ting to start a typewriter service for 
students at Tech. 

University Life Committee 
Chairman: Linda Byars 

Vice Chairman: Tracy Noack 

Academic Committee 
Chairman: Larry Heck 

Vice Chairman: Mark McKinney 

The Academics Committee is 
currently looking into mandatory 
computer literacy for all under-
graduate curriculum. They have 
just concluded a survey of Tech 
students of their thoughts of 
Dead Days and a plus/minus 
grading system. They are also 
trying to get library hours exten-
ded to include Friday and Satur-
day evenings. 

Dr. Cavazos and Senator Laura 
Young discuss school policy. 

Polling places are available in the following buildings: 
- Agricultural Sciences 	- Home Economics 
- Architecture 	 - Law School 

- Business Administration 	- Mass Comm. 

- Civil and Mech. Engineering - Math 
- Holden Hall 	 - Univ. Center 

The University Life Committee has 
just finished promoting Texas Tech 
throughout Lubbock during the 
Sesquicentennial with a video and 
information booth and sponsoring 
a representative to the ceremony 
honoring Vice President George 
Bush. They are looking into the 
student's role of the future Tech 
Park, soon to be located in front of 
Chitwood and behind the Tech Rec. 
Finally, the University Life Com-
mittee is trying to make Tech more 
aware of elections through a 
campus-wide publicity campaign. 

Senators Ardith Hill and Sam Miya-
gawa talk during the SA Board of 
Regents Reception. 

Senators Linda Byars, David Fisher, 
and Terri Scott voice their opinion 
during a Senate meeting. 

Tech Bookstore Says Vote 
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Pizza Express 
Mondays and 	 747-8888  

$50 	Tech Area I  Wednesdays Only z 	792 8888 

Large 16" one-item Pizza 
For $7.13 + 37. tax = $750  
One Coupon Per Pizza 

Name 	 Address 	  

West Lubbock I 

793-8888 II 
South Lubbock 

Expires: 4/15/86 I 
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Letter Perfect Typing... 
Letter Perfect Timing... 
Letter Perfect Location... 
Letter Perfect Secretarial Services 

4W-1- 

(opening near you March 1 7th) 
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Spend Your Spring 
Fashion Dollar Wisely 

at Lucy's 
Cotton Tops 
and shorts S4 to '16 

High Quality Clothes 
At a Fraction of 

Thier Original Cost! 

Jordache 
Levi 
Chic 
Liz Clairborne 

All '8 to '16 

* Shoes '6 to '26 

799-1567 
Melonie Square 	81st & Indiana 

"How Ginny's took me 
from a size 17 to a size 
81/2  in 60 seconds!", Aber 

1 never thought reducing could be 
so easy. I just called the Ginny's near-
est me and brought my 17" original 
to them. In less than 60 seconds, 
they took inches off and left me a 
svelte copy of my former self!" 

Ginny's will reduce anything 
Before 	 but our list of services 

11" x 17" We'll not only reduce, enlarge, collate, bind or color 
your copies, we'll also print everything from letterhead to cook-
books quickly, accurately, and with a smile. 

At last, a wait-reduction center for printing 
and copying. 

without sacrificing quality, 
just call Ginny's. Reducing 	

linnYg 
If you 

Printing • Copying 
was never easier. 

See the Yellow Pages under "Copying-  for the Ginny's nearest  you. 

After 
81/2" x 11" 

Spring Break Specials 
Reg Sale 

• Sensi Sandals 

• Stubbies Jams 

• Bermudas 

• Stubbies Corduroy Shorts 

• Socks 

• Stubbies & Head 
T-Shirts 

$6.50 

$12.50 

14.00 

$9.00 

$2.00 

$7.25 

'12.95 

$24.00 

$23.50 

17.95 

$4.15 

14.50 

New Shipments Arriving 
Daily! 

Free Vaurnet Sun Visor with 

Purchase of Vaurnets 

LSI 
SPORTS 

SPECIALTIES 
1609 UNIVERSITY 

762-0666 

'Bring this Coupon & 

GET 
IN 
 FREE 

= 

S 

AT 

M
"A400%11  

11%'‘`,96.fh s'eace 

"Play The Game ft 
at

t3  I 

coctst7 

tk1/4CCIA/A, eWate s 
5 

Dallas' largest 
and most exciting 

drinking and 
dancing emporium 
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6532 East Northwest Hwy 
at Abnms 

(214) 696-3720 
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Lubbock not so bad if you know where to look 
'n' roll from the '50s to the '70s. 

On Friday's from 10 p.m. to 11 p.m. 
is the Artist Spotlight. This program 
features 30 minutes of continuous 
music from two of today's hottest 
artists. 

To catch up on the latest hits, you 
can tune in Saturdays from 10 a.m. to 
noon for the Top 20 Countdown. The 
countdown is based on "Radio and 
Records" magazine. 

Then from 1 p.m. to 4 p.m., the 
Metropolitan Opera can be heard via 
satellite transmission from the 
Metropolitan Opera in New York. 

From 1 a.m. to 4 a.m. on Saturday 
nights is three hours of all-request 
music. 

To hear the best of urban contem-
porary music, turn to the Sunday Jam 
from 7 p.m. to 1 a.m. 

So there you have it. Lubbock really 
isn't so bad. 

University Daily 
Lifestyles Reporter 

10 p.m. to 1 am. This show features 
primarily contemporary fusion, but 
also some New Orleans-style jazz. At 
midnight, a new jazz album release 
can be heard. 

Reggae, African pop, and SKA 
music (fast reggae with horns) can be 
heard on the Dreadlock Rock show on 
Tuesdays from 10 p.m. to 1 a.m. 

On Wednesday's, also from 10 p.m. 
to 1 a.m., is KTXT's Outer Limits pro-
gram. This show features alternative 
new music geared toward the non-
mainstream listener. 

On Thursdays, starting at 10 p.m. 
"Off The Record" with Mary Turner. 
This show features interviews with 
some of today's top musicians. After 
"Off The Record" is the album 
preview, featuring top contemporary 
albums in their entirety. 

At 11:45 p.m. is the Cobweb's pro-
gram. This features the best of rock 

Joni 
Johnson 

Dawg's on Wednesday nights. You 
may recall that there is such an event 
common in clubs on Sixth Street in 
Austin. 

The Sing-A-Long can be really 
great fun. It brings back memories of 
theme songs from childhood TV 
shows as well as others. For instance, 
pretend you're Ginger "the movie 
star" while singing the theme song to 
"Gilligan's Island." Or even better, 
see visions of Mike and Carol Brady 
along with their six kids while singing 
the theme to the "Brady Bunch." 

As for those who complain about the 
radio station choices in Lubbock, 
have you turned to your campus radio 
station lately? Texas Tech's KTXT-
FM has several alternative programs 
that are the only ones of their type in 
town. 

For those into jazz, you can get your 
weekly intake on Monday nights from 

ranging from shoes to linens, and all 
merchandise is priced at outlet 
prices. 

On the restaurant scene, there are 
numerous eaterys that many don't 
know about, such as the Amistad 
cafe. This is a little hole-in-the-wall 
place that serves great food and has 
even better prices. 

If you're not into Mexican food, 
there's a great little Chinese food 
restaurant, called Chow Thai, that 
you probably drive by every day and 
never notice. Altough Chow Thai has 
a drive-thru window, I haven't decid-
ed yet if I want to consider it a fast 
food place. If you don't want to wait, 
call your order in advance. 

As for the Lubbock nightlife, I have 
to admit that, at times, it is lacking. 
Nevertheless, the city is picking up. 

Something that many may not know 
about yet is the Sing-A-Long at Fat 

Well, let me tell you something, 
people. Lubbock isn't such a bad 
place. If you look hard enough you 
can find plenty of things to do. 

For example, the Llano Estacado 
winery, located on FM 1585, is a great 
place to learn a little about the Lub-
bock vineyards and do some wine 
tasting. You don't need an appoint-
ment, the drive is quick and it's all 
free. On Saturday, the tours begin at 
noon and go until 6 p.m. On Sunday, 
tours last from 1 p.m. to 6 p.m. 

Another gripe about Lubbock is its 
lack of places to shop. If you're bored 
with shopping at the mall or on 
University Avenue, there is the new 
Outlet Mall of America, located on 
19th just outside Loop 289. 

This mall, of which there are two in 
Dallas and one in Austin, is the latest 
craze in bargain basement shopping. 
Each store specializes in one thing, 

It seems that people always are 
complaining about the goings on in 
Lubbock, or rather the fact that there 
are no goings on. When I make my 
way across campus I often hear peo-
ple complain that there never is 
anything exciting to do. 

The basic consensus seems to be 
that Lubbock is a drag. Many people 
who go to school here believe this as 
well as people who don't. And frankly, 
I'm especially sick of hearing people 
who have never been to Lubbock say, 
"Ooh, you go to school in Lubbock. Do 
you fly to school with the dust?" 

Former Doobie Brothers member pleased with solo career pace 
By The Associated Press "Then I pretty much put performing on the back 

burner," he said. He produced a record for Delta, which 
has his sister Maureen as lead singer, and one for his 
wife, Amy Holland. 

Producing made McDonald put a studio behind his 
house. 

NEW YORK — Michael McDonald doesn't think of 
himself as working in the fast lane. 

"I look at myself as a turtle compared to a lot of hares 
around me," said the former lead vocalist, keyboardist 
and songwriter of the now defunct Doobie Brothers. 

"If I've learned anything, it's to go ahead and take the 
pace that's best for me. I don't try to match other artists 

"More than anything, the studio helped me break out 
of something I was burning out in — writing pop music," 
he said. 

very comfortable," he said. "If the band were still go-
ing, that's exactly where I'd be now. The solo thing is 
something I knew I should try. If I never tried it, I would 
always wonder." 

For the Doobie Brothers, which folded in 1982, 
McDonald wrote a legion of hits, including "Takin' it to 
the Streets," "Minute by Minute" and "Real Love." 

McDonald's first LP came out in 1982 just as the 
Doobie Brothers' farewell tour began, and he toured solo 
in 1983. 

lick for lick." 
McDonald and Kenny Loggins wrote the 1979 Grammy 

song of the year, "What a Fool Believes" and Loggins' 
hit "This Is It." With Carly Simon, he co-wrote her hit, 
"You Belong to Me." His first solo album, "If That's 
What It Takes," came out in 1982 and his second, "No 
Lookin' Back," was out in 1985. He's now working on a 
third. 

Still, his solo career is almost reluctant. 
"With the Doobies, I knew I held one niche and I was 

PROBLEM PREGNANCY? 
Are you considering 

Abortion? 
Confidential 

Free Pregnancy testing & referrals 

Call (806) 792-6331 
Lubbock, Texas 

$3 	IT PAYS TO HELP! 	$ 3 
Earn extra money this spring! All returning 
donors from fall and spring of last year will 

receive an extra $3 with this ad. 
()Pala one per person) 

Come by 2414 Broadway 
or Call 763-4321 

$3 	UNIVERSITY BLOOD-PLASMA 	$ 3 

SPRING BREAK 
IS A GOOD BREAK FOR YOU! 
SHOW YOUR TECH ID AND GET 

15% OFF 

MARCH 12-14 
(GOOD ON ALL MERCHANDISE EXCEPT SALE ITEMS) 

TOWN AND COUNTRY SHOPPING CENTER 762-3262 

THE TOGGERY 
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Recreational Sports 
Articles on this page are provided by Recreational Sports and are paid for by the advertiser below, K. Kay Hopkins, Editor 
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Intramural Basketball 
Finals Tonight 

IM BRIEFS 
Racquetball Reservations Available 

fourteen rebounds while adding 19 
points. Swanigan took point honors 
with 23 points and took down eleven 
missed shots. 

In the Greek final, played before a 
packed house, Sigma Chi 'A' was 
down 19-15 at the half. Behind the 
clutch shooting of Blair Casey, Trey 
Meador, and Jim O'Reilly, Sigma Chi 
ran off a 10-4 surge to take the lead for 
good from Phi Delt 'B'. Scott Parten 
led Sigma Chi on the boards with nine-
teen rebounds, while Blair Casey 
dished off eight assists. Trent Hillard 
led a balanced Phi Delt attack with 12 
points and four assists. 

The Residence Hall title was 
secured in the final seconds as Gil 
Brassard hit two clutch free throws. 
The Desert Penguins were led by 
Keith Hill's exceptional defense and 
Russ Robinson's offensive output (25 
points). 

IEEE captured the club crown a se-
cond consecutive year on Rusty 
McDonald's 22 points and John Lord's 
12 points. Delta Sigma Pi also had two 
players in double figures. Scott Hunt 
(10 points) and Harry Rover (10 
points). 

If you can't afford the trip to Dallas, 
fear not, Tech's Final Four is already 
underway. In the divisional cham-
pionships Monday evening, four 
teams advanced to the All-University 
Playoffs by a total of 1] points. 

In the Greek finals, Sigma Chi 'A' 
topped Phi Delt 'B' 45-44 while the 
Desert Penguins downed Homeboys 
66-60 to capture the Residence Hall 
crown. Club honors went to IEEE 
with a 3 point win over Delta Sigma 
Pi, 43-40. The open title went to Real 
Deal who held off Weymouth BB, 
62-61. 

In women's action, the All-U cham-
pionship will be, decided tonight at 
7:20 in the Rec Center when the win-
ner of last night's MVP-Blitz game 
meets the winner of the Hoopsters-
Kappa Alpha Theta game. 

Men's action wil begin at 8:30 p.m. 
with IEEE-Sigma Chi winner taking 
on the Real Deal-Desert Penguin 
victor. 

In the divisional finals, Mike Gard-
ner of Weymouth BB and Clarence 
Swanigan of Real Deal led their 
respective teams in points and re-
bounds. Gardner gathered a high 

Scores 
Court reservations for Tuesdays through Fridays may be made one day in 

advance by calling 742-3352 or in person in the Rec Sports Office, Room 202 
from 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. Monday-Friday. 

Saturday and Sunday reservations will be taken on Fridays as described 
above. 

Any unreserved courts on the day of play will be given out through the 
Sports Shop in person or by calling 742-3828. 

Wednesday 	 7:30 a.m.-7 p.m. 
Thursday 	 7:30 a.m.-7 p.m. 
(Racquetball courts closed for refinishing) 
Friday 	 CLOSED 
Saturday 	 CLOSED 
Sunday 	 2-10 p.m. 
(Same day racquetball reservations) 
Monday 	 Regular Hours 7:30 a.m.-Midnight 

Same day reservations will be in effect for March 17 and 23. 

Spring Break Aerobic Offered 
Aquatic Center 

Hours for spring break aerobic classes are: 
Friday - no classes 
Saturday - 4-5 p.m. 
Monday - 5:30-6:30 p.m. 
Tuesday - 5:30-6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday - 5:30-6:30 p.m. 
Thursday - 5:30-6:30 p.m. 
Sunday - 6-7 p.m. 

Noon aerobics will be Tuesday and Thursday. 
All classes in the Lower Level Multipurpose. 

Basketball 
Men 

TTUHSC B 75 	 
Home Boys 55 	 

Prosecution 41 
Little Rascals 150 

Jokers H 56 	  Something 53 Sneed 69ers 46 	 BM's Kids 38 
Outsiders 67 	  Reject 40 Desert Penguins 45 	 Penthouse 43 
Sand Horns 56 	  Grot 54 Cert. Denied 55 	 Warhorses 39 
Phi Delt B 44 	  TICE B 39 Celtics 51 	  GPP Rock Drs. 34 
Pike B 59 	  Sigma Chi B 46 Sand Horns 58 	 Outsiders 45 
Major-Minor 42 	 Alpha Kappa Psi 36 IEEE 60 	  Zoomba Pellets 55 
Komana Wana-Leu 64 	 Young Life 50 Set Brawlers 62 	 Major-Minor 46 
Weymouth BB 60 	 Jokers II 55 Delta Sigma Pi 50 	 ASLA Bandits 38 
Zambonie 69 	  Lynxsters 57 Bad News 35 	  Horn Hall Hornets 34 
Real Deal 54 	  Question Marks 48 Zeta 44 	  R.K. Gamma 35 
Average White Boys 64 Air Express 54 Blitz 41 	  Special K 29 
Weymouth 960 	 Bledsoe Blitz 59 MVP's 33 	  Pi Beta Phi 29 
Times Square 84 	 Silver Bullets 67 Hu Stling Gang 48 	 Procrastinators 40 
Joysticks 53 	  Bobcats 33 Tokyo Tulips 29 	 Bad News 21 
Action Potential 47 	 No Class 40 Coalesled Dominance 39 Little Rascal 157 

Friday 	 7-8 a.m., 12-1:20 p.m., 3-4:45 p.m. 
Saturday 	 2-5 p.m. 
Sunday  	 CLOSED 
Monday 	 12-1:20 p.m. & 4-6:30 p.m. 
Tuesday 	 12-1:20 p.m. & 4-6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday 	 12-1:20 p.m. & 4-6:30 p.m. 
Thursday 	 12-1:20 p.m. & 4-6 :30 p.m. 
Friday 	 CLOSED 
Saturday 	 CLOSED 
Sunday 	 2-6:45 p.m. 
Monday 	 Regular Hours 12-1:20 p.m. & 3-8:45 p.m. 

Different Entries Due 
Exercise-Nutrition Seminar Planned Indoor soccer leagues are being formed for men and women. There is a $25 

forfeit fee. 
Entries for indoor soccer and 3 on 3 volleyball are due Thursday. 
Volleyball leagues include men's, women's and co-rec. This is call your 

own volleyball and there is no forfeit fee. 
Maximum of four people per team. Co-rec teams may be two men and one 

woman or one man and two women. 

Many have heard diet plus exercise is the best way to lose weight and keep 
it off. Learn the latest concepts of exercise and review nutrition ideals 
Thursday at 5:15 p.m. in the SRC classroom. 

Please register by calling 742-3352 so enough handouts will be prepared. 

Intramural Rodeo Coming 

Snorkeling Clinic Arranged 
The Texas Tech Intramural and Tech Exes Rodeo will be March 29 at Dub 

Parks Rodeo Arena (Quaker and 4th). 
Events include bareback, saddle bronc, bulls, call roping, novice calf rop-

ing, ribbon roping, team roping, steer wrestling, break away, barrels, goats 
(no horse), chute dogging (no horse), steer saddling (no horse), and calf 
dressing (no horse). 

Advance registration and entry fees are due by March 25. For further in-
formation contact Brenda Shroyer at 795-3066. 

Tonight at 5:30 p.m. in the Aquatic Center, Julie Whitsitt will conduct a 
snorkeling clinic instructing basic techniques, equipment and the best 
places to go. 

The clinic is free and is offered to all eligible Aquatic Center users. Par-
ticipants who have their own equipment should bring it to the clinic though 
snorkeling equipment will be furnished for those who need it. 

For additional information please call 742-3897. Injury Clinic Continues 

Spring Break Hours Set 
Recreational Center 

Dr. Robert Yost, orthopedic surgeon and leading authority in sports 
medicine, is offering his services free of charge to students, faculty and staff 
on Wednesdays at 7 p.m. 

The purpose of this clinic is to educate students concerning athletic type 
injuries that could have occurred while participating in some form of recrea-
tional or athletic activity. 

All the injury clinics are free and open to anyone eligible to enter the Stu-
dent Recreation Center. 

Clinics will be held in the classroom located on the north end of the upper 
level. 

For further information contact the SRC Office at 742-3351. 

Laura Scott and Barry Kirkpatrick review equipment records in the 

Outdoor Equipment Shop located in the Student Recreational Center. 

Camping, skiing and water sports equipment are available for 

students, faculty and staff rental. For more information call 742-2949 

any afternoon. 

Friday 	 7:30 a.m.-5 p.m. 
Saturday 	 2-6 p.m. 
Sunday 	 CLOSED 
Monday 	 7:30 a.m.-7 p.m. 
Tuesday 	 7:30 a.m.-7 p.m. 
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Bookstore Basketball Entries 

Due March 27 

Photo by Greg Henry 

Drew Nieswiadomy scores a goal in an intramural indoor soccer game. 

Sign-ups are due Thursday in Room 202 of the Rec Center for this spr-
ing's play. 

Coming Soon... 
Activity Entries Due 

March 12-13 
March 12-13 

	 March 12 
March 27 

Intramurals 
Indoor Soccer 	  
3 on 3 Volleyball 	  

Special Events 
Rio Grande Canoe Trip 
Bookstore Basketball 	  
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BAR—B—QUE 
* SPECIAL * 
Wednesday March 12 

11:00 AM-2:00 Pm 

Two Bar-B-Que Sandwiches, Potato Salad, 

Beans, and Beverage 

'2 5° 
Want A Beer With Your Bar-B-Clue? Add 504. 

Carry Out Orders Always Welcome 

811 University 

744-5677 

airport shelter park 
"Lubbock's Preferred Parking' .  

TEXAS TECI1 STUdENT DISCOUNT 

$325  a day and gas is 890 a gallon 

Free Shuttle—will handle luggage—

Covered Parking-24 hr security & 

attendant for your convenience. 

We accept American Express, Visa, & Mastercard 

Bring this ad in for one free day of parking! 
(limit-one ad per vehicle) 

CORNER of REqis & QUIRT (AT Flashing liyhT) 744-1004 

MALE REVIEW 
7:00 to 9:30 p.m. 

Doors opon at 6.00 p.m. 

$3 Cover Charge 

500 Drinks 

After 9:30 p.m.: 
50C Beer till 10 p.m. 

$2 Cover for guys 
$1 Cover for girls 

YAK4010fAlfe 40141(401411094KIWAYIKVAIV/KinliVAIIVIKWAIIIKdol. 

   

• Balloon Bouquets 

PARTY PLUS. Luau Supplies 
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"WEST TEXAS' MOST COMPLETE PARTY SUPPLY STORE" 

765-6633 	2 LOCATIONS 	795-1443 
Town & Countru 4th & Univ. 	 66th & Univ. 

fij1 "‘  
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RESTAURANT & BAR 

TONIGHT'S THE NIGHT! 
AND HERE2- WHAT HAPPENS: 
TUESDAY/Tr'HFER & LADLE'S NIGHT 

	

Buy 1 menu item 	.e second one of equal value is on us. 

Ladies drink free 41 8-11 p.m. with $1 cover. Guys: no 
P.; over, 95C Drafts. 

WEDNESDI,;/CHEESEBURGER BAY 
ACH PARTY 

%1b. cheeseburger 0,.9 Fries $1.89 from 5-1/ p.m. Beach Party 

starts at 8 p.m. w *b;OC draft from 8-9 p.m. From 9 p.m. to 

	

2 a.m. $1 Margai 	95C Draft, $1.50 Blue Hawaiians, 75C 

Wine Coolers. Wear your beach attire! 

THURSDAY/94 FMX NIGHT 
Join the FMX staff for 94C mixed drinks, 94C beer 

& 94C nachos 

ALL NIGHT LONG 8.2 
FRIDAY & SATURDAY 

COME DANCE THE NIGHT AWAY. 
50C Drafts from 8-9 p.m. 

Kitchen open Tues.-Fri. 5-11 p.m. Sat. 7-11 p.m. 

TUES-FRI HAPPY HOUR 5-9 P.M. 
Double Drinks & $1 Drafts. Free munchles 

	

14th AT UNIVERSITY 	DRESS CODE 	763.6558 

I 	 

College Night 

Wednesday 
$3.00 60 oz Pitchers 
$1.25 Call Drinks 
750 Draws 

Tuesday 
"Ladies Night" 

Free Beer and 95¢ Drinks for the Ladies 
From 7:30 p.m. to 12:00 a.m. 

TOWNDRAV/ 
"The Am113111111g hi'leth&E 

Where There's Never a Cover 744-8381 

At4INSTIREET)  
HAPPY HOUR 4-7 

$1 OFF ALL DRINKS • $2" PITCHERS 
MONDAY—GREEK NIGHT 

WEAR YOUR GREEK LETTERS & GET 50¢ DRAWS ALL NIGHT 

TUESDAYS-50t OFF DRINKS & BEER 
WITH TECH I.D.  

WEDNESDAY—NEW LADIES NIGHT 
FREE BEER & $1 DRINKS 7-12 

THURSDAY 
$1 LONG ISLAND TEAS AND MARGARITAS 

SATURDAY 
ALL NEW HAPPY HOUR 3.7 

NEW HOURS: M-TH 3 P.M.-2 A.M. 
FRI 1 P.M.-2 A.M. 

2417 MAIN 	SAT 3 P.M.-2 A.M. 	 762-0940 

ca • or a 93 
1611 unlver5ity 	 7 3.- 

)06, 

E  ,
PAS of WgARE 

kLI NGLAS 9,E,F5 

10.4 or 

$ 1 2 IT PAYS TO HELP! 	$ 1 2 
Earn extra money this spring by donating 

Blood-Plasma. New donors earn $12 
with this ad. 

Come by 2414 B Broadway 
or call 763-4321 and 

Ask about our $10 bonus 

GIVE LIFE! GIVE BLOOD-PLASMA AT 

$ 1  2  UNIVERSITY BLOOD-PLASMA $ 1 2  
We honor all Care for Life Coupons! 

o Long 
. 

ulp& 	c er 

Solid cc Prink 	lad Shirts 
090:ition 16eac Pants 

?aiA-Jstftzi:v.. 

of le y910r1- 
pocict.c6)...) 

7 	I7 T T 7 T 7-T7 

  

The University Daily 8 — March 12, 1986 

 

  

Benford finally gets just reward 

Tony Lydell Benford stood near 
midcourt at Reunion Arena Sunday, 
basking in the glory of Texas Tech's 
successful defense of its SWC Post-
Season Classic crown. 

The senior guard had played all 40 
minutes during the Raiders' 67-63 
championship win over Texas A&M, 
but you never would have known it. 
Benford was in his own world, his own 
heavenly cloud nine. He was light 
enough to walk on water, and after 
the way he played in the tournament, 
nobody would have been surprised if 
he had tiptoed across the Trinity 
River. 

Benford was the hero, as he has 
been so many times this season and 
before, after scoring 53 points in the 
three tournament games. Somehow, 
even the tournament's most valuable 
player trophy didn't seem like just 
compensation for what he's meant to  

a young Tech team that just two 
weeks ago seemed headed for Rat-
tlesnake Knob, Texas — nowhere, to 
be more specific. 

Benford never has been one to take 
his due credit, though. His teammates 
said all year that Tony was their man, 
their No. 1 leader on a team that need-
ed leadership as much as it needed its 
red-and-white Converses. He's played 
the role to perfection, leading by ex-
ample, never allowing his teammates 
discouragement to drown their 
potential. 

That quality isn't something new. 
During Benford's high school and col-
lege careers he's often shown flashes 
of brilliance. 

And he's never really gotten the 
recognition he's deserved. 

I've had the privilege of watching 
Tony play since he was in junior high. 
Back then, he had a certain cockiness 
about him, a trait not uncommon to 
rising young athletes. 

Benford played at the same junior 
high as former Tech star Jeff Taylor 
several years before. He surpassed 
most of Taylor's junior high records, 
but nobody noticed. Jeff and his 
brother Vince were stars at Hobbs 
High School then, and they were at- 

tracting all the attention. 
As a high school sophomore, Ben-

ford helped Hobbs to a New Mexico 
state title and was named to the all-
tournament team. Legendary Hobbs 
coach Ralph Tasker often compared 
him to former Hobbs and Los Angeles 
Laker great Bill Bridges. 

Still, that state title belonged to a 
talented group of Hobbs seniors and a 
junior named Vince Taylor. Benford 
would have to wait for his glory. 

Hobbs repeated its championship 
the next year and Vince was named 
New Mexico Player of the Year. That 
championship was Vince's, although 
Benford played a major role. Vince 
went on to join Jeff at Tech. 

Finally in 1982, Benford was named 
New Mexico's top player. Unfor-
tunately, Hobbs didn't win the cham-
pionship. He followed best friend 
Vince to Lubbock, where he played in .  
near obscurity for three years behind 
everybody's hero, Bubba Jennings. 

While Bubba was sinking his ar-
tillery shots, Benford sat patiently on 
the bench. He played in all but one 
game in his entire Tech career but 
always seemed to be in the shadows. 

Benford started 22 games last 
season as Tech won its first SWC title  

in 13 years. His contributions were 
overlooked as the Raiders' five 
seniors received all the accolades. 
Chances are that without Benford, 
Tech might not have won that crown. 
His 15-footer at the buzzer beat No. 2 
SMU in Lubbock, then he calmly sank 
a clinching free throw — as Mustang 
fans shook the basket — to beat the 
Ponies in Dallas and wrap up the title. 

The championship belonged to the 
seniors, though, and Benford still 
lacked the crown that he could call his 
very own, the one that he made hap-
pen. Only two weeks ago, Benford's 
career seemed to be in its twilight as 
the Raiders fluttered helplessly in the 
lower quarters of the SWC. 

But due largely to Benford's leader-
ship, Tech rebounded and beat three 
of the league's top teams to end the 
regular season, then carried away the 
tournament trophy. 

If the All-SWC first team could be 
selected all over again, Benford 
would be a surefire pick. Instead, he 
had to settle for second team. But he 
outplayed them all at Reunion, and 
he's got the MVP trophy and the team 
championship trophy to show for it. 

More important, he's finally got 
HIS championship. 

Gandy Slathers/The Urnyersdy Daly 

Golden touch 

Texas Tech senior guard Tony Benford concentrates on a jump shot 
during Tech's 67-63 win over A&M Sunday. Benford was named 
the SWC tournament's most valuable player. 



CLASSIFIED SECTION 
DEADLINE 11 A.M. DAY PRIOR TO PUBLICATION 1 Day 	 

RATES BASED ON 15 WORDS OR LESS 	2 Days 

CASH ADVANCE OR VISA & MASTERCARD 	3 Days 

NO REFUNDS 	 4 Days 
5 Days 

$3.00 
	 $4.50 

	 $5.25 

	 $6.00 
	 $6.75 

VILLA SONORA 
(Quiet & Affordable) 

ASK ABOUT OUR STUDENT 

SPECIAL 
52nd at Utica 795-9191 

WANTED 
Persons between the ages of 18 & 35 

in need of contraception, to partici-

pate in two year study on new oral 

contraceptive. Sponsored by 08-GYN, 

TTVHSC. 

Benefits include free physical, lab 

work and birth control pills. For more 

information contact: Marie Hart 

743-2479. 

BARBRA:E. 

Homemade 
Breakfast 

7:30 am-10:30 am 
Mon.-Fri. 

2419 Broadway (rear) 

;40,,trivAiirairArAiv.arraits 

This is the fife at COBBLESTONE 

T • 

Come see for yourself the 
complete remodeled Cobblestone 

Apartments. Pre-leasing for summer/ 
Fall Semester. 

Cobblestone Apartments 	762-5351 
2212 5th Street 

3 REASONS TO 
CHOOSE 

HONEYCOMB 
I oration:  

1612 Ave. Y 

Convenience: 

1/2  block from T.T.U. 

Price: 	
Starting at $175 

w/all bills paid option 

Efficiencies one & two bedrooms 

HONEYCOMB 
763-6151 

Next year 
' you could be on 

scholarship. 
An Air Force ROTC 2-year 

scholarship. Which not only pays 

your tuition, but also gives you 

$ 100 a month allowance. And 

picks up the tab for your books 

and lab fees, as well. 

And after college, you'll receive 

a commission in the Air Force...go 

on to further, specialized trai-

ning..-and get started as an Air 

Force officer. There'll be travel, 

responsibility, and a lot of other 

benefits. 

But it all starts right here-..in col-

lege...in the Air Force ROTC. 

Things will look up...so look us up. 

No obligation, of course. 

Put it all together 
in Air Force ROTC 

FAMILY PLANNING 
795-1453 CLINIC 5308 Slide Rd. 

Free Pap Test for new patients 
flee Prey-since Tos1.1 

Reasoned* lee for: new paliems. yearly CbSCA•up birth 
control methods, female end mwor medical pleblems. 

Byledy Or. 	 No App'. Nestled 
Mon-frl 6.9 0 m 	 Sal 2.5P d 

SUMMER BUSINESS 
OPPORTUNITY 

The Standard Coffee Company is offering 
summer sales-internships to business min- 

ded students for the Summer of 1986. 

Positions are available in all major cities of 
the East, Southeast & Southwest. (NYC 

excluded.) Position involves new customer 
sales of Office Coffee Service accounts. 
Program includes full training with pay, 

guaranteed earnings and substantial bonus 
opportunities. 

Earnings of 1985 Summer employees 

ranged from $1,950 to $4,100. Career 
opportunities upon graduation are availa- 

ble. 

This experience is a must for anyone seri- 
ous about a career in business. Must have 
car, and be available to work for a minimum 

of 10 we eks. 

SYSTEMS PROGRAMMER 
Plains Cotton Cooperative has an immediate opening for an 

experienced OS or MVS Systems Programmer. Preferred experience 

includes CICS, VTAM, and NCP. Experienced COBOL Programmer 

would be considered. Plains offers a comprehensive benefit program, 

new computer facilities and interesting, innovative work. Call or send 

resume to: 
Personnel 

Plains Cotton Cooperative Association 

P.O. Box 2827 

Lubbock, TX 79408 

EOE 	806/763-8011 M F 
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Dallas celebrates 'biggest 
win in franchise history' 

Carter, after Dallas had rallied from 
a 13-point deficit in the fourth period. 

"I can't describe how good this 
feels," he said. "We know we belong 
in the NBA now. It took us a long time 
to break the Celtic spell." 

Dallas did it without high-scoring 
Mark Aguirre, who was out with the 
flu. Guard Rolando Blackman scored 
32 points for the Mays and hit a pair of 
game-clinching free throws in the last 
eight seconds. 

"It's very exciting for us to beat 
Boston," said Blackman. "It ranks 
right up there with the first time we 
got into the playoffs." 

Dallas Coach Dick Motta said he 
wasn't sure he would ever see it. 

"It was going to come eventually 
whether I was the coach here or Rip 
Van Winkle," said Motta. "Bird put 
on a clinic and we were fortunate to 
survive." 

By The Associated Press 

DALLAS - Dallas Mavericks' 
owner Donald Carter tipped his 
cowboy hat back like the good guys do 
in Western movies when they've just 
run the bad guys out of town. 

"This is the one we've been looking 
for," he said. "Now we know we 
belong in the NBA. It's the biggest 
win in franchise history by far." 

Dallas' dramatic 116-115 victory 
over the Boston Celtics Monday night 
was the first in the six-year history of 
the expansion Mavericks over the 
Celtics. 

It came on their 12th try on a night 
when Boston's Larry Bird tied a Reu-
nion Arena record with 50 points and 
hit four shots from three-point range. 

"The Boston Celtics are the bulls-
eye you shoot for," said a jubilant 

TYPING PART-TIME: Clerk, hours 
8 00a m -12.00p.m.(Monday-Fridayl. Office ex 
patience a plus. Contact Susan at 762-0406. 

SHERRY'S Word Processing & Copies. 4907 
Biownfield Hwy., Resumes, Legal, APA, Graduate 
School Approved. 7970680. 

PART-TIME: Temporary grounds keeper. Contact 
Susan at 762-0406. 

PAYLESS CASH WAYS: Part-time employment oppor 
tunnies. Evenings and weekends. Apply in person. 
102 E 50th. 763-4346. 

PROFESSIONAL WORD PROCESSING ANO EDITING. 
Guaranteed quality. rush jobs, theses, dissertations, 
articles. Graduate School approved. 793-0881.  

PORKY'S Bar-B-Q: Now accepting applications. All 
positions, Flexible schedule. Please apply in person. 
82nd and Quaker. 

ACCURATE: and all work guaranteed. Spelling cor-
rected. IBM Correcting Selectric III. Call Vicki 
741-1548 

STENOCALL is accepting applications for 
14:00p.m.•10:00p.m I shift. Includes weekends and 
holidays. 25-30 hours a week. Call 762-0811 

PROFESSIONAL word processing typing-academic or 
business-fast-accurate-editing-spelling checked-
reasonable-guaranteed. 745-9062 

Excellent Income for 

part-time home assembly 

work. For info. call (312) 

741-8400 ext. 527. 

Word processing. Papers, manuscripts, medical, legal. 
Proof copies offered for editing purposes. Call Judy 
832-5798. 

PROFESSIONAL Typist. Technical & foreign language 
experience. Errors corrected; work guaranteed. Con-
veniently located. 763-9003 or 763-3565. 

TYPING done in my home. 51.00 per page, double 
spaced. Call between 8:00a.m & 11:00p.m. 
745-2219. 

FAST: Accurate typing. Reasonable rates, Selectric II. 
Call Melissa 797-8637 

SPECIAL RATES...$99 Move in Special 
block from Tech. Furnished 1,2 bedrooms. Summer rates available. Our 

apartments have exactly the features you want - pool, laundry, party grills, 
security gates, and entry systems, ceiling fans, off street parking, land- 

scaped courtyards. Students Welcome. S99 is all for the month of March. 

• Sundance 2410 Street 765-9728 • 

1 ANGEL/NA 'S 
ALL YOU CAN EAT 

SPAGETTI $3.50 
SANDWICHES ALSO AVAILABLE 

50th & Q 6-9  13  rT1  744-6744 

ACCURATE typing: Term papers, resumes, free 
editing. proof reading. Reasonable rates. Fast service. 
Call (9:00-7 00p.m.). 794-5942. 

QUALIFIED. ACCURATE TYPIST-Work guaranteed. 
theses / dissertations, word processing / typewriter 
capabilities. Minor corrections. Near Tech. Mrs. 
Hert-765-9030. 

PROFESSIONAL typing. 91 00 double spaced page. 
New IBM typewriter. Spelling, grammatical errors cor-
rected Call 762-8602. 

WEEKDAYS-WEEKENDS: Typing-general, medical, 
statistical, engineering, graphwork, chartwork. 
Anytime 8:00a.m-10:p.m. Debbie 799-7513. very 
reasonable. FREE!FREE!FREd 
PROFESSIONAL typing: Papers, resumes, theses, 
dissertations. Experienced in medical and scientific 
terminology. Call Tina 747-1479 SPRING 

BREAKERS: 
Professional service by typing teacher and technical 
writer Corrections made. Word processor. Annette 
Hollis. 794-4341. FURNISHED 

FOR RENT 
PROFESSIONAL Typing-Word Processing-Resumes-
Quick Printing. West Copy Center 4902 34th, Terrace 
Shopping Center 793-2451. 

PRESENT THIS COUPON AT 
WORD PROCESSING, reasonable rates, quality work. 
Pick-up and delivery available. Call after 5 30p m., 
799-2432. 

1 BEDROOM House: Very clean, At the rear, 2011 
10th. 4st blocks from Tech. Local 863-2324. ebrigea street Pub 

in CORPUS CHRISTI 
FOR 	F 

FREE! FREE! FREE! 
With $10 Purchase 

1 BEDROOM: Brick duplex, garage and off-street park-
ing. 5185, water paid. 793-1180 or 765-5271. PROFESSIONAL TYPING: Reasonable rates, ex-

perienced in legal terminology, fluent with MGT. 3373 
assignments. Call Lori 794-7186. 2 BLOCKS from Tech. 2 bedroom furnished apart-

ment. Excellent condition. 9275 plus gas and electric. 
799-2823, after 5:30p.m. TYPING: Reasonable rates. Term papers, resumes, 

etc. Call Sylvia 797-8433. 
2 OR 3 students. Large 2 bedroom, furnished, 
semester leasing, fenced yard. private drive. 2313 8th 
(rear), 746-6505. 

IBM Selectric Ill, Call Margie Sandifer for typing, 
744.2651, M-F. after 6p.m.. anytime on weekends, 
52' page. 

Spann Typing Services FOOD, FUN & 
GREAT LIVE ENTERTAINMENT 

EVERY NIGHT! VISTA-AERO ADAMAS: Bicycle' 25" frame' Shimano 
components tool bag cyclometer' water bottle' yellow 
5166792-6484. 

UNFURNISHED 
FOR RENT 

"Same Low Typing Fees Since 1975" 
• Si per standard pica double spaced page! 

• Resumes 55-515 per page 

4210-D 50th Street "Your Complete Typing Service" 

• 

MISCELLANEOUS 799-0825 

799-3341 
4165. gas paid. 1 bedroom, partially furnished. 2023 
17th rear, Mike Stotts. 795-7127/799-7932. ANGELINA'S RESTAURANT: ALL YOU CAN EAT 

SPAGHETTI, FOR 53.50, SATURDAY. 
11:00a.m -2:00p.m. (50th and Avenue 0). HELP WANTED 2 ROOM: Large closet, garage apartment. Furnished, 

bills paid. $100 deposit. rent $ 225. Call 747-1169. 
2405 14th: Two bedrooms, one bath, stove and 
refrigerator available. 5280 plus gas. SS block from 
Tech. 797-5055. $100 REWARD: Lost 50th & H area. Black' Mahogany 

female Rottweiier. Wearing black collar with 
Oklahoma tags. Contact Denise at 743-2870, 
765-8714. 

APARTMENT: Furnished Unfurnished, perfect for 
students Near South Plains Mall, Texas Tech Universe 
ty bus route. Bills paid. S180 per month. 799-2846. 

DAY cook wanted. Apply at J. Patrick O'Malieys 
1211 University. 

2625 29th St.: One bedroom house. Stove, 
refrigerator pravide4. 5150 deposit, $250 a month. 
792-4536. EXPERIENCED leasing agent. Apply in person at 

Boardwalk Apartments.  
EFFICENCY apartment at 2119 14th rear. Walk to 
Tech Singles only. 5160 monthly. 5100 deposit. 
797-9850 evenings. 

2 ROOM cottage- Picked fence. Roses. Yard kept 
Clean, 5150 plus bills. 1708 Avenue W. 765-7187. FASTEST growing company in Lubbock. Part-time 

positions available. Earn 9400-5800 monthly. It you 
work well with people call Jeff at 792-7237, after 
4 - 00p. m. 

EFFICIENCY: One and two bedrooms. Naw tenants 
free month rent with Spring lease. Yr block from cam-
pus. Quiet environment. Internatonal students 
welcome. 2410 8th Street. 763-1494. 

LARGE 2 bedroom duplex. Near L.C.C. 5275. water 
paid. 793-1180 or 765-5271. 

LUXURY: 2-2-2 brick duplex near mall, $455. water 
Paid. 793-1180 or 765-5271. 

NICE: 2 bedroom bnck, FP, Wd connection spacious. 
Brick duplex-6101 37th $360. Rose Realty 
745-1868. 

FULL and part-time work available. Looking for com-
petitive minded people. 5500-$900 monthly. Call 
Miss Layne. 797-7330, between 9:30-5:00p.m. 

LARGE efficiency. Roomy kitchen. Full size bath and 
closet. 765-5184. 

NATIONAL Marketing Company: Seeks individual or 
group to be campus representative for Abilene' Lub-
bock area. Must have transportation and 2 and 3 days 
a week available. Excellent pay. Meet students and 
have fun. Contact Vicki: 1-800-592-2121. 

NEAR Tech. Clean 3 room furnished apartment. Bills 
paid. Yard maintained. One adult only. No pets. 9195. 
795-3046. SCHOLARSHIPS AVAILABLE 

$135 MILLION - in financial aid went 
unused last year. Freshmen, Sop., 
ongoing graduate students; for help 
cashing in on those funds, call Academic 
Data Services toll free 1-800-544-1574 
ext. 639, or write P.O. Box 16483, 
Chattanooga, TN 37416. 

Probably the nicest one bedroom you'll find! 5225. 
Lawn kept. Block from Tech. 2319 13th. 765-71 82. 

NOW leasing for summer and fall. Reduced summer 
rates. Office hours 2-5p.m. 2406 Main, J Bar J Apart-
ments. 763-1494. 

TWO bedroom. One bath tub and shower. Real nice, 
fully carpeted, all appliances, WITH WASHER.DRYER 
4300 a month. 794-6929. 

NEEDED: Experienced computer sales representative. 
Knowledge of IBM compatibles required. Call for infor-
mation and interview appointment - 793-5828. Only 
experienced persons need apply.  

NEED dependable babysitter from 
10:00a.m.-4:00p.m. IM-F) 540 plus meals. 
Negotiable hours. 799-6405. 

NOW leasing for summer and fall. Reduced summer 
rates. Office hours 2-5p.m. 2406 Main. Copperwood 
Apartments. 762-5149. 

UNBELIEVABLY nice) 1 bedroom, spotless, quiet, 
lawn kept, 1 block from Tech. All bills paid. 5275. 
2313 13th. 765-7182. 

CONVENIENT to Tech: Fenced, private drive, 2 
bedroom. Semester leasing. $220 plus bills. 2313 8th 
(rear), 746-6505.  

WHISPERWOOD: Quadraplex, 2 bedroom, 1 bath. 
Washetdryer. refrigerator, fireplace. Very nice, conve-
nient to Tech. 5400, N. Troy. Westmark Residential 
Management. 793-8759. SERVICE PART-TIME SALES: National manufactumg company 

now hiring part-time sales representative. Self-
motivated, sense of humor and professional ap-
petulance. This position allow flexibility in work hours. 
For appointment call between 8:00a.m. and 9:00a.m. 
IMonday.Friday) 799-8831 ask for Charles Dodson. 

PRIVATE 1 bedroom garage apartment. Separate 
bedroom, nice carpet, central heat. Private fenced 
yard. Near Tech. 5150 plus. 792-1167. 

WHY live in the Ghetto? Rent this rear house at 2912 
21s-t. 5215 monthly. Bills paid 793-5820. NEED Dance music for your party? DJ ALL TYPE 

MUSIC. Kevin 745-1430, ROOMMATE. House two blocks from Tech, 5145 
Gary. 744-8866.  

FOR SALE 
Pregnancy Counseling 

Services of Lubbock 

793-8389 
10:00-2:00 Mon.-Sat. or Appointments 

Free Pregnancy Tests 

4930 So. Loop 289 207B 

SHADOW APARTMENTS.  New management. 2 
bedrooms furnished and newly remodeled. 5300 plus 
electricity 2413 9th. 799-5756. 

University Plaza is now accepting appli-
cations for position of Resident Assis-
tant. Summer and academic year ope-
nings are available, and applications may 
be picked up from 8-5 at the University 
Plaza office. Deadline for returning com-
pleted applications, March 26. No phone 
calls, please. EOE, M/F/H. 

1984 Mustang GT. White and black. Only 17,000 
plus miles. Loaded. Very clean. 793-6246. SPECIAL RATE: 1, 2 & efficiencies, 1 block to Tech. 

Designed for students- bookcase, dishwashers. 
disposal. security gates, pool, laundry 763-7590. 

SUMMER Rates Now: Spacious two bedroom apart-
ment. Bills paid. "1626 Y". Gerald Burke 796-0501. 
Coldwell Banker Rick Canup Realtors 

3-2-2: Under appraisal 536.950. 4-2-2 Westwind 
$ 5 9. 9 5 0 Rose Realty 745-1868. 

'80 Toyota Corrola: Excellent condition. May new 
parts. Will negotiate. 794-8496. If no anwser, leave 
message .  

Help Us Stamp Out Imisomm• 
Dorm Food! 

SUPER clean 1 bedroom. 2413 14th. 5225. all bills 
paid. Nice furnisher. VD block from campus. Available 
immediately. First month free rent. Must see to ap 
predate. 797-5056. 

GOOD clean Mobile Home in Camelot. Priced right. 
would consider rental. Rose Realty 745-1868.  PERSONALS 

Drivers to deliver pizzas part time 

nights and lunch. $3.40 per hour 

plus liberal mileage allowance. 

Must be 18 and have own car. 

Apply in person at 2227 19th. 

GPZ 750 1982: New rear tire, clutch. Taxed till 1987. 
fast enough. Call to deal 795-1540. 

INFLATABLE raft, Six people. 1 2001b. capacity. Made 
in Italy with 5 horsepower motor and all accessories. 
One year old. Mint condition. 5500 744-1956. 

The Colony House Apartments: Across from Texas 
Tech. Reasonable rates, very large. Student specials, 
call Saiz, 747-8021 or see them at 2619 19th Street. 
Manager Apt. 26 

LOST: Black pager on Tech campus. near Electrical 
Engineering or 6th Street Hair Shop. REWARD 

747-2657, Little Hollywood. CROSSWORD PUZZLER  
ROOMMATE: To share three bedroom house. 9150 
monthly plus bills. Call Jay 744-4498. Location 2211 
29th. 

WALK TO SCHOOL: 1 bedroom apartment also effi- SUNN Beta Lead Stack Amplifier, $900. Great shape. 

ciency. 746.4011 	 Call 792-0406. after 5. 
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or more information call Mon. & Tues. only 

1.800-423-1771 

Ask for Mr. Underwood 

N A 
RIVENDELL TOWNHOUSES 

4402 22nd. Apt. 10 

2 bedroom, 11/2  bath. 
furnished. All bills paid. 
Laundry, pool, patios. 

799-4424 
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ABODE 
Now Leasing/Prices Drastically Reduced! 

STUDIOS and 1 bedroom 

Very Attractive, 3 min to Tech 

797-5970 	Manager: Faye Sledge 
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ADVANCE 
To THE Boardwalk 

PASS CO 
And Collect 5100 

On The 1st Month's Rent. 
S 50 Deposit 

5540 19th Street 	 793-2214 

ry 

C' 'see 114044 Fens 54414..• 

CROSSWORD PUZZLE COURTESY OF.. 

P ANCAKE H OUSE 
OPEN LATE 	 6th & Ave Q 

DOWN 6th ST. TO PANCAKE HOUSE 
* **************** 



Before you rent, come by Savoy and let us show 
you the advantages of home ownership. 

Our Same Quality Homes at Reduced Prices 
• Individually Controlled and Secured Guest Entry 

• Beautiful Courtyard 

• Hot Tub 

• Fully Equipped Kitchens 

• Swimming Pool 

• Full Size WasherDryers 

• Designer Interiors 

Models Open Daily 

M-F 9-6 
Sat 11-5 
Sun 1-5 

Savoy Condominiums 
(806) 797-3030 

303 Detroit Lubbock, Tex 79415 
Texas Wats (800) 692-4591 

CONDOMINIUMS 

Wednesday  
Ladies Night 

Open Bar 
for everyone till 11 p.m. 

No cover charge for ladies 

Thursday 
Open Bar 

till 1 1 p.m. for everyone 
75C Beer and 
1/2  price drinks 

till midnight 

EVERY WEDNESDAY • LATE NIGHT 

SING ALONG 
AT THE DAWG 

The funkiest piano bar in town. Who would've thought 
you could have fun singing the theme of "Gilligan's 
Island" - Join the growing number of crazies for $2 
pitchers 9-1 1 and sing along at the Dawg. 

GRILL NOW OPEN FOR LUNCH 
JUICY BURGERS • SMOKED CHICKEN • TASTY TACOS 

FRIDAY & SATURDAY( 

MARCIA BALL 
OAF & GRILL)  

BURGERS • TACOS • SMOKED CHICKEN 

• • • • si • • • • • • i 
MI  I  I I • • • 	I I I I I I • I I I I I I 

Walk across University Avenue 
for the good life! 

University Plaza is a student housing facility 
providing privacy, an adult living environment, 
and the conveniences that you hope for. 

Full food service (optional meal plans) 
Private or Double Rooms (with connecting bath) 
Affordable prices 
Individual lease liability (Academic period lease) 
Weekly maid service 
Computer room 
N Lounges (Wide screen also) 
Two swimming pools 
Recreation room 

Laundry facilities 
Optional covered deck parking 
Active social and sports programming 
Basketball / Volleyball court 
A responsive, congenial staff 
Quiet floors, if preferred 
Optional payment plans 
Paid utilities 

Coming soon, Our 

Private Fitness Center 
All of these amenities for your ease of lifestyle, thereby eliminating the 
worry of unknown utility costs, the hassle of cleaning and cooking, the 
need to drive miles to class, and the absence of social interaction often 
experienced in an apartment setting. 

Cross the street, take a tour, and become eligible for a Free Room and 
Board drawing. Tours must be taken prior to April II, 1986. Demand 
dictates a first come, first served policy.  

University Plaza 
1001 University Avenue • Lubbock, Texas 79401 
Telephone 806/763-5712 
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UT defends Simmons' car lease SPORTS  BRIEFS  

Men's tennis... 
By The Associated Press newspaper advertisement. He also 

said there was no evidence to indicate 
Simmons knew the owner of the car 
and nothing to indicate that Simmons' 
lease and his employment were "sug-
gested, arranged for, or assisted in 
any way by members of the UT-
Austin athletic staff." 

AUSTIN — The University of Texas 
said Tuesday a car purchased by 
Longhorn running back Edwin Sim-
mons was the result of a transaction 
in which Simmons "received no 
preferential treatment from the 
seller.' 

Dr. Ronald Brown, vice president of 
student affairs, said the Houston law 
firm of Vinson & Elkins had in-
vestigated Simmons' use of the car at 
the request of the university. 

Brown said the law firm had been 
asked to share its findings with the 
NCAA "and stands ready to assist the 

not been in Simmons' possession 
since August 1985. 

Brown said the investigation includ-
ed interviews with all persons involv-
ed with the lease-purchase as well as 
with Simmons, his employer and 
members of the Longhorn athletic 
staff. 

NCAA staff with any additional infor-
mation they may need to conduct 
their own investigations." 

Brown said, however, "As of this 
date, the university has not been in-
formed of an 'official inquiry' into the 
matter by the NCAA Committee on 
Infractions." 

The Austin American-Statesman 
reported that Simmons had leased a 
1984 BMW in April 1985 from Austin 
accountant Tee Bowman and had 
paid more than $4,210 on a down pay-
ment, three monthly payments and 
insurance. 

A spokeswoman for the UT News 
and Information Service said the car 
ultimately was repossessed and has 

"The owner of the Rockdale service 
company that employed Simmons is 
not a University of Texas graduate 
and did not attend as a student. He is 
not a member of any University of 
Texas booster organization and did 
not assist with the recruitment" of 
Simmons, according to Brown's 
statement. 

The American-Statesman reported 
that Simmons had received $4,451 in 
wages from H.J. Wilson's oilfield ser-
vice company for work during the 
1984 winter break, spring break last 
year and for nine weeks last summer. 

Brown said Simmons purchased the 
used automobile after responding to a 

Former Tech volleyballer appeals decision 

The Texas Tech men's tennis team 
came from behind Tuesday to defeat 
West Texas State 5-4 in a non-
conference dual match in Canyon. 

The Raiders, down 2-4 after singles 
competition, won all three doubles 
matches to claim the victory. Tech 
had defeated WTSU 7-1 in the 
Raiders' opening match of the season 
Feb. 13. 

David Leatherwood and Dick Bosse 
won the No. 1 doubles match 6-3, 4-6, 
6-2 against Anthony Sandler and Greg 
Drose. Luis Segovia and Alan Wie-
nand beat Dean DiGorge and Brett 
Maxfield in the No. 2 match 4-6, 7-5, 
6-1 and in the No. 3 match Ted Invie 
and Steve Kordas defeated DeWayne 
Pybus and Robin Spiers 6-3, 6-3. 

In singles, Tech's No. 4 player, 
Segovia, beat Maxfield 6-1, 6-3 and 
Kordas defeated Spiers 6-1, 7-6 in the 

No. 6 contest. 
West Texas State won four of six 

singles matches, including the No. 1 
match with Sandler winning in three 
sets over Leatherwood 6-1, 2-6, 6-4. 
DiGorge won the No. 2 match 6-2, 6-3 
over Invie, Drose defeated Lamar 
May 6-4, 6-0 and Pybus beat Wienand 
6-4, 6-3. 

The Raiders, 8-5 on the year, will 
host Midwestern State today 

—MICHAEL CORBET7 
By BRAD WALKER 
University Daily Sports Reporter Women's tennis... The University Council will hear an 
appeal from Texas Tech junior 
volleyball player Stacy Blasingame 
to regain her athletic scholarship at 
10 a.m. today in the academic council 
room of the administration building. 

Head volleyball coach Donna Mar-
tin opted not to renew Blasingame's 
scholarship for the upcoming fall 
season. Martin suspended Blas-
ingame for one game during the 1985 
season. 

to renew Blasingame's scholarship is 
unjustified. 

"They didn't renew her scholar-
ship, and we're saying it should have 
been renewed. That is the issue," 
Griffith said. 

According to Tech Athletic Director 
T. Jones, the decision to renew a con-
tract rests solely with the team coach. 

"Letters of intent are one-year 
scholarships," Jones said. "It's nor-
mally the coach's choice as to 
whether the scholarship is renewed or 
not." 

Martin had no comment on the 
matter. 

Blasingame's lawyer, Thomas J. 
Griffith, said he believes the problem 
is strictly a personal one between the 
coach and player and said the failure Jones said Tech requires that the 

coach notify the athlete before June 1 
if the scholarship is to be terminated. 

Blasingame led the Raiders in solo 
blocks with 33 for the year and 16 dur-
ing Southwest Conference action and 
had the second most total blocks with 
74 and 27. She held team highs for 
most block assists in a game (7) and 
most digs in a game (25). 

For her play against Texas A&M, 
she was the first Raider ever to be 
named the SWC Player of the Week 
(Oct. 20-26). 

Tech finished fourth in the SWC in 
'85 and graduates only one player 
from that squad. 

Spring break is rapidly approaching, and Texas Tech's women's tennis 
team can hardly wait. The Red Raiders' match today with Midwestern 
State will be their fifth in eight days; they are ready for a long rest. 

Consequently, Tech plans to make a short day's work of MSU when the 
two square off at 2 p.m. at Hillcrest Country Club. 

The Raiders are coming off a big win over New Mexico State Monday and 
stand 6-2 for the spring, 104 overall. MSU is 4-6. 

Tech coach Mickey Bowes has shuffled his lineup due to a case of tennis 
elbow to Paula Brigance, his usual No. 6 singles seed. Shannon Cizek will 
make her first singles appearance of the spring in place of Brigance, while 
Nicole Barrett will replace her in the No. 3 doubles position. 

"I'll get an opportunity to see two players that don't usually play," Bowes 
said. "They practice everyday and if I can get them in there, it's good." 

Bowes also will move Petra Pennekamp to the No. 1 singles spot in place 
of Annemarie Walson, who will play at No. 2. 

"I don't think we'll have any trouble at No. 3 doubles,". "This is not one 
we'll worry about. I have no problems with this lineup change," he said. 

The Raiders are wary of facing a small school such as Midwestern, when 
intensity sometimes is lacking. 

—BRAD WALKER 
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