
WEST TEXAS MUSEUM COMPLEX—This is an architect's 
conception of the proposed $6 million museum complex 
that received approval by the Tech Board of Directors 

in their 'Saturday meeting. The museum will be built 
in a triangle formed by Indiana Ave., the .Brownfield 
highway and 4th St. 
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Offers contract to ousted prof 

Tech board moves toward end AAUP `blacklist' 

Johnson clue 
at meeting 
in Uruguay 

PUNTA DEL ESTE, Uruguay (API 

—Latin-American chiefs began arriv-

ing for the hemisphere summit confer-

mice Monday under security arrange-

ments that turned this South American 

sea resort into a virtual military fort-

ress. President Johnson is due todas 

URUGUAYAN WARSHIPS patroled 
offshore, Anti-aircraft batteries nestled 

in strategic spots. Uruguayan soldiers 

and police guarded a three-square-mile 

security zone surrounding the chalet 

where Johnson will stay on the ocean-

side. They patroled on foot, horseback 

and in cars. 

The conference, aimed at pumping 

new life into the Alliance for Progress 

and raising Latin American living 

standards, opens Wednesday in the 
gambling casino of the plush San Ra-
fael hotel. 

Secretary of State Dean Rusk, who 
arrived last week, and Latin Ameri-
can foreign ministers have been pre-
paring the agenda for the summit 
meeting over the past few days. 

DISCUSSIONS HAVE centered chief-
ly on increasing U.S. aid to Latin 
America, a Latin-American common 
market and the easing of restrictions 
on the flow of Latin-American goods 
into U.S. markets. 

Latin Americans are asking the 
United States to permit them to pur 
chase goods with U.S. aid money in 
countries other than the United States. 
One U.S concession might be permis-
sion to use the money within a Latin-
American common market. 

In one security measure, U.S. offi-
cials asked that a huge wrought iron 
chandelier be removed from the ceil-
ing over the circular conference table 
in the San Rafael Casino for fear that 
it might fall. Local authorities reluc-
tantly complied. 

A MARCH OF COMMUNIST youths 
to "repudiate" the summit conference 
in general and President Johnson in 
particular was continuing along its 70-
mile route from Montevideo to Punta 
del Este. But 100 of the original 200 
marchers have dropped out. The pace 
was being set by a sturdy young girl 
student striding along in a brightly col-
ored shirt and dark slacks. The march-
ers have covered about 50 miles. 

He was preceded into Punta del Este 
by Prime Minister Eric E. Williams of 
Trinidad-Tobago, and Presidents Al-
fredo Stroessner of Paraguay, Jose 
Joaquin Trejos Fernandez of Costa 
Rica, Julio Cesar Mendez Montenegro 
of Guatemala and Joaquin Balaguer of 
the Dominican Republic. 

THE OPENING SESSION Wednes-
day morning will be devoted to official 
greetings of the government chiefs and 
their delegations to President Oscar D. 
Gestido of Uruguay, the host. This will 
be followed by the first informal ses-
sion, lunch and a second informal ses-
sion in the afternoon. 

State Sen. H. J. (Doc) Blanchard of 
Lubbock, in an informal appearance 
before the Tech Board of Directors 
Saturday told them he believes Gov. 
John Connally's tax program current-
ly before the legislature is "in trou-
ble." 

BLANCHARD MADE THE R E. 
mark while discussing Senate recom-
mendations for Tech appropriations for 
the 1968-69 biennium. He said $28 mil-
lion had been recommended, an in-
crease of $8 million over the last bi-
ennium. Tech had requested $47.8 mil-
lion. 

"I'd like to see you get everything 

Court to hear 
`screening' suit 

The Tech Supreme Court will hear 
arguments on a suit challenging the 
constitutionality of the cheerleader 
screening board tonight in the Ag En-
gineering Building. 

THE INFORMAL HEARING WAS 
postponed due to the request of Rob-
ert Hoffman, counsel for the Tech Stu-
dent Association, who said he needed 
time to prepare a defense. 

The suit was filed by Randy Hilton. 
a campaign manager for a coed who 
made a recent unsuccessful bid for a 
cheerleader position. 

Hilton said in a letter to Chief Jus-
tice Lonnie Dillard that a screening 
board for candidates should be author-
ized by a constitutional amendment. 
not a Senate bylaw. 

THE HEARING AT 8 P.M. IS OPEN 
to the public. 

Tech's Board of Directors moved 
Saturday toward removing itself from 

the "blacklist" of the American Asso-

ciation of University Professors by of-

fering a contract to one of three pro-
fessors ousted by the board almost ten 
years ago. 

THE CURRENT BOARD voted 
unanimously to rehire Dr. Byron Ab-
ernethy as a full professor with tenure 
in the department of government be-
ginning Sept. 1, subject to removal 
from the list of censure. 

Board member C. A. (Buzz) Cash 
of Amarillo described the action as a 
"bitter pill to swallow," but moved 
adoption of the measure "if this will 
get the problem solved." 

Board member Herbert Allen of 
Houston, who seconded the motion, 
added that "if this ammunition will 
serve to accomplish our purpose, let's 
do it." 

DR. S. M. KENNEDY, vice presi-
dent for academic affairs, is expected 
to take the proposal to the AAUP corn- 

you ask for, but this is impossible," 

Blanchard told Board members. "I 
can't agree with the insatiable appetite 

for funds shown by most schools and 
departments in state government." 

The senator predicted that Connal-
ly's tax proposals would "be very dif-
ficult to pass," and mentioned spe-
cifically the proposed cent-per-gallon 
gasoline tax increase and repeal of the 
Colson-Briscoe Act, which appropriates 
money for farm-to-market roads. 

"AND WE'RE NOT GOING TO 
pass a liquor-by-the-Mink bill and tax 
it for anyone," he said. Blanchard 
said the proposed increase in corpora-
tion franchise tax had the best chance 
of passing in the legislature. 

He predicted the legislature would 
need "one, two and possible three" 
special sessions to pass a tax bill. 

Blanchard also told Board members 
"not to become alarmed because most 
of the bills 'are moving slowly." He 
said the Senate had recommended the 
proposed $1 million mesquite eradica-
tion program for Tech's School of Ag-
riculture be cut to $100,000. 

THE SENATOR ALSO REFERRED 
to his bill authorizing medical schools 
in Houston and Lubbock and a dental 
school in Dallas, 

He said Baylor University is "up in 
arms" concerning the dental school in 
Dallas since it would compete with its 
own dental school there. 

The Associated Press in a story from 
Austin said that extended Senate de-
bate postponed an expected controver-
sial committee hearing Monday on the 
recommended establishment of a new 
state medical school in Houston and a 
new dental school in Dallas.  

mittee on academic freedom and ten-

ure at its April 25-26 meeting in Cleve-

land. The committee will make a 
recommendation to the entire associa-
tion later in the week. 

President Murray said following the 
board meeting that the action "permits 
us to go to the AAUP with our side 
of the bargain." He said this would not 
be contingent upon Abernethy's ac-
ceptance of the contract, but only upon 
it being offered. 

ABERNETHY AND DR. HERBERT 
Greenberg were both ousted by the 
board after a four and one-half hour 
closed meeting net July 13, 1957. The 
job of Dr. Per Stensland, head of the 
department of adult education, was 
abolished at the same meeting. 

The board gave no reasons for re-
moval of the three and refused to 
grant them public hearings. The board 
was charged with being "politically 
motivated" in the incident, since all 
three were regarded as liberals and 
the board at that time was predomi-
nately conservative in their political 
views. 

Abernethy had made the keynote ad-
dress at a gathering of liberal Demo-
crats several months before his oust-
er, and was active in the previous 
state political campaign. 

TECH OFFICIALS HAVE SAID THE 
censorship has hurt Tech in the re-
cruitment of top faculty members and 
in securing federal and foundation 
grants. 

Since time of the censure, Tech has 
adopted a tenure policy guaranteeing 

Board to meet 
without talk 
of censor rule 

The Lubbock Parks and Recreation 
Board, meeting tonight, apparently 
will not discuss rules governing the 
censorship of art objects. 

THE CENSORSHIP RULES became 
a controversial subject when a piece 
of sculpture by a Tech student was re-
moved from an Architecture and Al-
lied Arts department display at the 
Lubbock Municipal Garden and Arts 
Center. 

The exhibit was shown March 19-
31, and the sculpture in question was 
later reinstated by the Parks and 
Recreation Board. 

A. C. Hamilton, director of parks 
and recreation, said the discussion, 
though previously slated for tonight, 
was not put on the agenda because of 
more pending business. 

"MY BOARD MEMBERS WERE 
mailed a list of rules," he said. "I do 
not anticipate any changes. For the 
moment, we're acting according to the 
old rules." 

'  Nolan Herrick, head of Tech's Ar-
chitecture and Allied Arts department, 
said Monday, "We're not concerned 
any further with the Parks and 
Recreation's business," 

to faculty members that they cannot 
be fired without adequate cause which 
usually must be related to the class-
room. 

The board amended the policy Sat-
urday to include a phrase which allows 
"full participation as citizens in the 
community." Other changes covered 
the reviewing of dismissals of faculty 

By KATIE O'NEILL 

Editorial Assistant 

Cessation of bombing in Viet Nam 
and possible admission of Red China 
to the United Nations are needed 
changes in American foreign policy 
said Dr. Kenneth Galbraith, Harvard 
economics professor, to an audience of 
approximately. 1,500 in. Lubbock Mu-
nicipal Auditorium Saturday. 

GALBRAITH, WHO WAS RECENT-
ly elected national chairman of the 
Americans for Democratic Action and 
is a former ambassador to India, was 
eighth and last speaker in the Tech 
University Speaker Series. 

He based his belief in the need of a 
cessation of bombing on the two facts 
that Ho Chi Minh has indicated that 
such a move might bring him to the 
conference table, and that Secretary of 
Defense Robert McNamara has said 
that the bombing has not accomplished 
its purpose, that of stopping Commu-
nist infiltration into South Vietnam. 

Galbraith also said that a country 
under bombing attack develops a re-
sistance to that kind of warfare, be-
coming defiant and determined to re-
sist. 

HE CALLED THE DECISION TO 
bomb North Vietnam "a great political 
blunder," and said that sooner or later 
the United States would be forced to 
accept a settlement that would leave 
the Communists in control of a great 
part of North Vietnam. 

A revamp of American foreign poli-
cy in the East is also in order, Gal-
braith said, and added that such a re-
vision might include the admission of 
Red China to the United Nations. 

The crumbling of the Communist 
mystique and, with it, the melting of 
the Cold War are changes in the world 
situation which American foreign poli-
cy has not been flexible enough to 
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accommodate, said Galbraith. He said 
that it is a basic tendency of bureauc-
racy to maintain the status quo, and 
that the foreign policy needed now is 
quite different from that of the Cold 
War. 

COEXISTENCE IS THE CORE OF 
the policy needed now, Galbraith saki, 
to deal with a "Communist bloc" which 
is now divided within itself by differ-
ences of opinion. The old idea of a 
unified conspiracy has been destroyed 
by recent strife between Russia and 
China, and the old policy of implacable 
hostility toward the Communist bloc 
has been outmoded. 

"Stability in foreign policy is only 

In other action, the board approved 

the offering of a contract to an ousted 
government professor which could re- 
move Tech from the American Asso- 
ciation of University Professors 
-blacklist" and approved the exterior 
design concept for the $3 million initial 
phase of the West Texas Museum. 

The board also approved the design 
of a flag selected in a student body 
election Feb. 24 to become the "offi-
cial flag" of the University. 

members and the time limits for the 
notification of dismissal. 

THE RECOMMENDATION FOR of-
fering the contract was made by Dr. 
Murray, speaking for Dr. Kennedy. Ne-
gotiations have reportedly been going 
on between Tech officials and AAUP 
officials in Washington, D.C. for the 
past several weeks. 

possible in a world which doesn't 

change," Galbraith said. "There is no 

reason for continuing the present U.S. 

policy except to maintain the status 
quo." 

In referring to U.S. policy in Viet-

nam, Galbraith said that country is 

paying the price for the United States' 

failure to adopt to reality. 

"THE NATIONAL LIBERATION 
Front (Viet Cong) represents a strong 
similarity to the national thinking in 
parts of Vietnam. We must bring our 
Vietnam policy abreast of the current 
situation." 

He said cessation of bombing should 
last "six months or so"—long enough 
for the "sincerity" of the move to go 
unquestioned. After that period, he 
said, negotiations would have to be re-
newed if negotions had not begun. 

"It's difficult to argue that the ma-
jority of people in the United States 
agree with the government's view," 
Galbraith said. "There's always been 
a certain contempt in the state de-
partment for American public opin-
ion." 

DIRECTOR AL ALLISON OF Level-
land pointed out that Tech "has not 
had a flag during the university's exist-
ence." He said Chi Rho fraternity had 
offered to pay for a flag pole in Mem-
orial Circle for the new school flag. 
Chairman Furr described it as a "job 
very well done." 

Director Herbert Allen of Houston, 
in proposing the name-change commit. 
tee, said the issue had "rested awhile, 
and it might be appropriate to re-open 
it." 

He said one of the main reasons for 
the name-change controversy of two 
years ago, in which no action was 
taken but emotion ran high, was that 
"everyone had their own committee." 
He said a combined committee to co-
ordinate the study should alleviate this 
problem. 

FOLLOWING THE MEETING Furr 
said the committee would be appointed 
with the intention of "covering all seg-
ments of college life." 

He said that, in his opinion, public 
hearings on the question would be the 
proper approach to the issue, but that 
the "committee will be free to take 
whatever approach they feel is neces-
sary." He said he hoped the committee 
would have its first meeting this week. 

The museum complex, to be located 
within a triangle bounded by Indiana 
Avenu,e Brownfield Highway a n d 
Fourth Street, will serve as the show-
case for Tech's International Center 
for Arid and Semi-Arid Land Studies, 
in addition to reflecting area history. 

THE COMPLEX WILL INCLUDE A 
central core unit, an agricultural-indus-
trial gallery, a planetarium, sculpture 
court and art galleries. It will be fi-
nanced through both public and private 
sources. 

Also announced at the board meet-
ing was the appointment of Loyd M. 
Lanotte, president and chief executive 
officer of 'LIME, Motor Freight, Inc., 
to spearhead a $2 million fund-raising 
campaign for the museum. Currently 
serving as president olf the Red Raider 
Club and vice president of the Cham-
ber of Commerce, Lanotte will work 
with Dr. D. M. Wiggins and Harris 
F. Underwood, announced last week as 
co-chairmen of the museum's Develop-
ment Council. 

Exterior exhibits will include a West 
Texas ranch headquarters featuring 
types of buildings used by early set-
tlers, a display of windmills from 
around the world, nomad house types 
and tracts featuring growing crops 
typical to arid and semi-arid regions 
of the world. 

IN OTHER POINTS OF action, the 
board: 

• Approved a request to ask for 
legislation to establish a 50-acre re-
search park for organizations such as 
government agencies, industrial firms, 
foundations and associations. 

• Passed a resolution endorsing 
pending state legislation to improve 
faculty fringe benefits in Texas' public 
collegs and universities. 
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Board approves 
Museum, sets up 
name committee 

By DAVID SNYDER 
Editor 

The Texas Tech Board of Directors, meeting Saturday morn-
ing in a short but fast-moving session, voted to create a diversified 
committe to study the name-change question and report back to 
the board by the "latter part of May." 

THE COMMITTEE, TO BE composed of representatives of 
the student body, faculty, ex-students and board, is expected to be 
announced either today or Wednesday by Board Chairman Roy 
Furr. He said the committee would be composed of either five or 
seven members. 

His bill may move 

Blanchard visits Tech board; 
medical bill debate postponed 

Galbraith cites policy 
no bombs, admit chinese 

Page 2) 

TIME CHECK—John Kenneth Galbraith checks the time Saturday before 
making his appearance as the last of this year's University Speakers Series 

guest lecturers. Galbraith spoke on changes he would its to see in American 
foreign policy, 
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• Authorized pniv e r s i t y 

Consulting Architect Howard 

Schmidt to coordinate the yen-
novation of the snack bar in 
Tech Union and retained an 

interior designer and food con-

sultant to work on the project. 

Schmidt will also conduct a 

feasibility study concerning 

an addition to the building, 
the first step toward expan-

sion. 

• Approved addition of the 

master of arts degree in jour-
nalism pending approval by 
the Coordinating Board, Texas 

College and University Sys-

tem. 

• Approved final plans for 

a $4.6 million biology building 

and authorized advertising for 

bids to be considered at the 

June 3 meeting. 

The faculty fringe-benefit 
legislation endorsed by the 

Board would establish an op-

tional retirement or annuity 

program in lieu of the present 

retirement plan. Anothe 
measure calls for a constitu 

COY'S SECRET 
COUNTRY INN 

4103 19th 

X - RAY SERVICE - Dr. S M Kennedy, Tech vice president 

for academic affairs, registers for a chest X-ray at the 

Physical Plant Monday. The mobile unit of the West Texas 
Tuberculosis Association had X-rayed 1,000 persons late 
Monday as part of an eight-day campaign. It will remain 

on campus through Thursday. Kennedy was the first person 
X-rayed by the unit when it was placed in operation two 
years ago. 

Board approves museum 

- An editorial 

Complimentary words 
Saturday's Board of Directors' session was a pro- 

ductive one, bringing to light two issues which 
for the most part have been guarded in silence for 
the past two years. We refer to the name-change 
and the AAUP (American Association of Univer-
sity Professors) censorship. 

* 	* 	* 
The Board moved to appoint a joint commit-

tee to begin work on the name-change question, 
indicating that it still hopes to recommend a 
change to the legislature during this session. The 
Board indicated it feels the appropriation bill is 
now the most important one before the legislature 
as far as Tech is concerned, so it could well wait 
until after approval of that bill to present its 
name-change recommendation. 

A five-to-seven person coordinating commit-
tee composed of students, faculty, ex-students.and 
Board members is a good approach to the poten-
tially-hot issue, if it functions as is presently en-
visioned. Board members believe one centralized 
committee will create much less friction than the 
several committees that appeared two years ago, 
and that its members can work harmoniously to-
gether. We hope this is true, and that it is not an 
overly-idealistic approach. 

* 	* 	* 
The Board also unanimously approved the 

proferring of a contract to Dr. Byron Abernethy, 
one of three professors fired by the Board amid 
charges of "political motivations" nearly 10 years 
ago. One Board member described the action as a 
"bitter pill to swallow," but that it was "neces-
sary." This attitude is markedly different from 
that of the Board in past years, and is to be com-
mended. The action should go a long way,and 
possibly even could be the final move, toward re-
moval of the censorship. 

We hope the Board and administration will 
continue to make known its progress in both mat-
ters, and especially that the activities of the name-
change committee will be open to the public. 
Meanwhile, a complimentary word is in order for 
Saturday's session. 

Job interviews are set 

`Egg throw' 
scheduled 

Did you ever have the com-

pulsion to throw an egg at 
someone in authority? 

Tech students will have 
such an opportunity Wednes-

day at 6 p.m. in front of Sneed 

Hall. 

SNEED HALL wing advi-

sors will be the targets. 

DR. C. EARL HILDRETH 

Optometrist 

Visual Analysis 

Contact Lenses 
Vision Related to Reading 
P02-4828 2307 Broadway 

The President is the of-

ficial representative of the 

students and is called upon to 

greet visitors to our campus. 
speak to many various campus 

and community groups, act on 

seven faculty-student commit-
tees, and be the voice of 
the students in Southwest 

Conference affairs. 

THERE ARE many prob-

lems involved in being Presi-

dent. because there is so much 
going on in campus affairs 
that it is almost impossible to 
keep up with the changes 

and new ideas. Also, there are 

times that the Executive and 
the Senate or the Supreme 
Court do not agree; so, it is 

the responsibility of the Presi-
dent to solve these problems. 

I feel that the Executive 
Department needs to be ex-
panded and improved by the 

ai$dtion of three people to aid 
in Student Affairs, Publicity. 

and Southwest Conference af-
fairs. But I am also of the 
belief that the actions of the 

Senate, Supreme Court, and 
Executive this year have been 
in a good direction and that 

much has been accomplished. 

various departments of the 

a d ministration. 

the 170 univer-
sity organiza-
tions, and the 

14 faculty-stu- 

A
dent commit-
tees. Much of 

the Presdent's 

1111 . 1 . Br (  its time is spent in 

committee meetings and per-
sonal conferences. 

Teach
Teacher needs Mem bedroom for- er 

 home for summer. Ale moll- 
Boned. feared. References. Cell 
SIV5-61181-Deems, 

Banded Ironing and bahasittine. Iron-
Log $1.50 docrn. /Kr near Tech. 3101 
1st. Place. P03-6040. 

El iieiVROV apartmentnear rolled.. 
clean. alr conditioned, tented yard. 
carom, 1155 furnished. $50 unfurnished. 
2701 2nd St.. rear. sW5-5063. 

Clean, modern. lust redecorated. one 
block off-camous. Onr-bedroom and 
Iwo Oedroom duplex apartment. SIR. 
B larkburn. SW5-21013. 

Exceptionally sten furnished apart-
ment at 9304 lath Street. Bill, raid. 
Tech couple preferred. 4019-3211- 
Sift-1495. 

1.ohhoek'i most untotal Interior decor. 
Three-room bungalow apartment. 
Quiet atmosphere. CARRIAI.E. ROUSE 
AP ART,' ENTS. 1711/1 lath P05-8706. 

MISCELLANEOUS  
KATIE TUTOR: CortiDed experienced 
leacher. PW time tailoring be op-
'ointment. 2427 2500. 8117-4124. 

Wanted: Lacelnated bow In 45 lb. 
Clam, mum be bargain; call Chuck 
Seaga.. SW5-7010. 

LUDWICK 1)1111310 FOR MALE 
('ill publieation office Ext. 4031 and 
a.* tor Fred. 

FOR RENT 10 

THE SHADOWS 2431 910-1/31 Meek 
from Tech, 2 hdnn. Varnished-815; 
$146 Summer months. P06-51156, SW5- 
3435. 

$79.50 
Larne CoutemporarT - tarnished. MP 
tacolsbcd. quiet. Ono bedroom tad 
meads. Congenial Torn nelghboons 

LOOK INSIDE AND BE 

CONVINCED 
302-304-304 Sherman. Fee swan" 
meat Call PO 5-0029 

RED RAIDER APARTMENT. ander 
ore ownership, two bedroom fur. 
Indeed lora furniture) $09 per month . 

Two bedroom unfurnished 135 pet 
month. Located about itt hhoiss north 
Tech rampus. 2000 block.I ormii ❑ 
Street. M1 bills paid. ro:, - 0,an. ❑ 

INTERVIEWS  for: 

Sales and 

Sales Management 

Training Program 

This Program is designed to develop young college 

graduates for careers in life insurance sales and 

sales management It provides an initial training 

period of 3 months (including 2 weeks at a Home 
Oftice School) before moving into full sales work. 

Those trainees wbo are interested in and who are 
found qualified for management responsibility are 
assured of ample opportunity to move on to such 
work in either our field offices or in the Home Office 

after an initial period in sales. 

Aggressive expansion plans provide unusual op-

portunities for those accepted. 

Arrange with the placement office for an inter-

view with: 

DON MOODY, A GENERAL AGENT 
APRIL 13 

Connecticut Mutual Life 
INSURANCE COMPANY• HARTFORD 

The Blue Cap Company • Since 1 846 

Heat • Cooling • Ranges • Disposals 

1041100468••••••••••••••••••••••••• ■••••••••••••••••4110/10 

Refrigerators • Water Heaters 

301 Coilege Ave. 
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First of series 

President's duties listed 
ROTC frat pledges 
get early workout (EDITOR'S NOTE, The followIng 

article. first of a series of the. is 
published in cooperation nits, the 
Losernment Committee of the Stu-
dent Senate, Dirk Rotten. chairmen. 
Theyore Intended to promote a bet- 
ter understanding of student rol OM-
meet. Other articles are written in 
Mould:Ong eseestIve officers and We 
Chief Justice of the Supreme Emir,. 
All .111 he published Ortore meta- 
l.r officer election. April 21., 

By BILL BEE'CK 

President 

of the Student Assoelation 

The basic duties of the Pres-
ident of the Student Associa-
tion are outlined in Article III 

Of the Constitution. They in-

clude: 

• The presentation of a 
legislative program at 

the beginning of each 

semester. 
• The appointment of 

members of College 

Committees. 

• The presentation of the 

state of the student 
body to the Senate. 

• The execution of all leg- 

islation of the Senate. 
TO ACCOMPLISH these 

duties, the President must 

work very closely with the 

Tech Ads 
TYPING 

Esperlenred. term Memel. thrill, 
IBM SeleetTir. Spelling correeted, all 
work guaranteed. Jerry Gray. SW9- 
0071 after 5:30 p.m. 

Typing: Mr.. Menem, 3410 28th. 
kA11-232.8. Prefesdoosi typing. Tech 
graduate. experlenred. Work gamma-
teed. hew Herniae -too deetzle. Thesis. 
report, etc. 

Typing: Experienced. Electric type-
writer. Terra papers, then, etc. 
Spelling correeted. Work guaranteed. 
Mei. Welch, 3004 3010, M5-7365. 

Typing: Term papers. theses. dieser. 
teflon.. Mrs. Iheke, 3404 42nd, 
S003.5739. 

University 

TYPING 

Service 
Protesslosta/ typtetA IBM arbors 
Mrs. ALL WORK GCARANTEED, 
CONVENIENTLY LOCATED A-
CROSS FROM CAMPUS. It= Col-
lege, Phone PO 2-24311. If no ne-
wer CALL PO 3-8599. 

Bement prof...tonal ITPteltst IBM 
Wootrlos, wallow corrected. work 
imnenteed. 3060 34101. SW 1-5101 
SW 8-1907 evening.. 

TYPES°. EXPERIENCED. TERM 
PAPERS AND RESEARCH PAPERS, 
PAST SERVICE. lice. Ma•ehma. 1419 
Agana. r, 1.03-7800. 

E XPERIENCED TYPISTS. TWO, 
term paper, et, Br, Dillon, '2210-
471h, S144-2159. Mrs. Cu rry, 3 2207-
43rd, SD0-3737, 

FOR SALE 
Beautiful set of Cragar SS mare, fit 
all Ford and Chrysler Products. Call 
8W9-6754. 

1935 Chevrolet, two door sedan, set 
op for drag rarIng! 3108 47th St. 
Nee after 6 p.m. SW9-0761. 

Pre-recorded 4 track stereo Lapels 
03.5 Peach. 3 for 010, 8 for S25. 
Artist. Include Beatles. Stone, Mon-
kers, Raider., M. Bader. Yardhlrds. 
Unique,, Reschboys, Lettermen, J. 
Risers. T. Roe. Kingston Trio. K. Dy-
lan. Aady WIIIW,r, ('adt. 0. Jones. 
R. Pelee. B. Owens and mans, many 
others. Satistaction guaranteed or 
money refunded. Phone 1.).3.2309 Dan 
Bobseed. 

For Sale: reader bass-9100. Gibson 
reverb-echo annt-$120. Fender 'merit-
:who nolt.4115. Ext. 2411. 

1960 Mustang-GT 289 V-8 4 spd. 1904 
Valiant 4-dr. Big Si, 3 spd., air. 
('all P0 11-9722 after 5 p.m. 

4 track stereo tape eertddires, wide 
selection. Call Ray 002-5001. 31mr 0111 
tape deck also. 

Rant zso c.r. motorcycle. Call OWL 
2178 or P02-8393 after 6 p.m. 

'115 Mustang, 289, 4-speed, sir, Wm 
nes. also '04 Impala, 4-car., H. T., 
Loaded and clean x153-1010. 

1038 TR-3 Reed and Solt Top. Ton-
neau. therdrhe excellent condition. 
7195. P02-14389 after 5:40. 
brallth. 

"THE 
UPPER ROOM" 

Across horn Texas Tech 

By KAREN PORTER 

Staff Writer 

Sixteen 	new 	fraternity 

pledges are marching, run-
ning, jumping and drilling on 
the Tech campus this week. 

Dressed in green, they wear 

the conventional "duck bill" 
caps, and worry about looking 
"militarily slick" every day at 

5:30 am. 

They are the spring pledge 

class of Scabbard and Blade. 

national honorary military 
fraternity for college ROTC 
programs. They are working 
under a vigorous physical pro-

gram, and learning the con-
tents of a training manual for 

initiation into the society. 

LOU BARBOUR, San An-

tonio junior and public infor-

mation officer for the pledge 
class, describes Scabbard and 

Blade as a group furthering 
advanced ROTC studies in the 
U.S. military program. 

"This spring the group was 

able to select 20 juniors and 
five seniors for pledge rush-

ing," Barbour said. "During 

tapping out ceremonies. 16 
cadets were chosen to under-
go the two-week pledgeship." 

"Last week we were con-
cerned with getting to know 

our pledge brothers and learn- 

ing the information in the 

manual," Barbour explained, 

"All of the men are enthusi-

astic, and there is a friendly 
atmosphere between actives 

and pledges when we're not 
at our early morning military 

formations. Then it is strictly 
business." 

AT 5:30 EACH morning this 

week the pledges "fell in" into 
a fiveman, three-line platoon. 
After undergoing inspection 

by the actives for polished 
boots and pressed uniforms, 
they launched into close-order 

drill, more than 60 push-ups 

and other exercises. 

Scabbard and Blade primari-
ly consists of Army members, 

although men in the Air Force 
and Navy programs may be 

asked to join. The society is a 
special one for the military 
which meets twice a month to 
.plan various functons and dis-

cuss military science policy. 

PLEDGE WEEK will end 

with a dinner at the Officers' 

Club at Reese AFB Friday 
night when the new members 

of Scabbard and Blade will 
relax from the week of early-
risings and exercise and Visit 
with their new friends and ac-
tives. 

CHARLES L. ALLEN 

Publisher, T h e Journalism 

Quarterly, National Publisher, 

Publisher's Auxiliary, a n d 

The Alpha Tau Omega Palm. 
W. E. Garets,lournalism de-

partment head said, "Dr. 'Al-
len is a recognized authority 
in journalism education, and 
has had long and valuable 

experience in all aspects of 

the profession. We are de-
lighted that he could join U.S.' .  

COY 
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Job interviews will be 

granted to students today as 
representatives from 25 com-
panies meet on campus for 

Delta Sigma Pi's "Careers 
Conference." 

The conference will begin at 
noon ,when Lubbock Mayor 

W. D. Rogers Jr. speaks at a 
luncheon in the Tech Union 
Ballroom. Tickets for $1.50 

are on sale in the Union. 
The luncheon will be fol-

lowed by personal interviews 
in the Ballroom. The inter-

views will last from 1 -5 p.m. 
Bill Maupin, Delta Sigma 

Pi public relations charman, 
said any student may talk to 

a company representative  

concerning job opportunities. 
He said most of the repre-

sentatives are from companies 

in the Southwest. 

"We have tried to get com 
panies offering job oppor-
tunities in most fields," he 
said. 

Insurance 
Auto-Casualty 

Leroy Waggoner & Co. 
Monthly 

Payment Plan 
SH7-3228 

1401 - 19th 

tional amendment to remove 

the present 58.400 ceiling on 

member contributions to the 

retirement system. 

A third measure would au-
thorize payment of appropriat-

ed funds for salaries for full-

time faculty members for de-

velopment, research or study 
leaves. The final bill would 

repeal statutes prohibiting the 

state from making financial 

contributions toward premi-
ums on certain group Insur-
ance policies, including life 

and health insurance and disa-

bility coverage. 

DR. MURRAY announced 

two grants to the university at 

the session. The American As-

sociation of Petroleum Geolo-

gists has awarded a $11,500 
grant to Tech Evaporite In-

stitute, a division of ICASALS, 

Murray said. 

The Robert A. Welch Foun-

dation has awarded Tech 

$139,350 in grants for chemis-
try research covering 10 re-

search projects. Several yers 

ago the Welch Founds on 

'

awarded the chemistry de-

partment a $1 million re-

I search grant, largest in the 

I history of the university. 
China eabinet, eft of Mc mahogany 
chairs. Mosey table. 	 cabinet, 
lamp, 	 tape recorder. OD 5.9236 . 0121:8SEEC0001a0E 

Sportiest . 	 . 1968 Dation 1600 1
I 
 LI 

Roadster hardtop and 	sollilep. 
13.000 miles: radio and heeler. Asking 
52093. See at 2119 1410. P05-5981. 

❑ 

    

Chuck Ewing 

Continental Razor-Hate 
For Men 

Reduced Rates cot' 
Tech Students 

Hair-Straightening 

   

   

    

   

   

❑ 

a 
a 
a 

 

Linda Odom 

LOOK AT WHAT IS NEW 

AT THE UPPER ROOM: 

The Best Looking 

Barber ... Would You 

Believe Hairstylist in 

Lubbock. 

  

Call Today for an 

Appointment 

MANICURIST 

Open Mon. - Sat. 9-6 
1203 College 

Suite 205 	PO 3-6663 

   

11•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

MARRIED STUDENTS ONLY 
Tech Village 	I University Village : Varsity Village 

	

$85.00 	• 	$87.50 	: 	$92.50 
: 	 :  

2902 • 3rd Place : 3102 - 4th Street : 3002 - 4th Street 

	

P02.2233 	: 	P03.8822 	: 	P02.1256 1•••••••••••••••••••••••••••••i•• ■•••••• 
All 1-bedroom, Furnished, Utilities Paid 

Pool - Full Laundry - Month to Month Rentals 

Children Welcome - No Pets 

GENERAL ELECTRIC 

In journalism 

MA degree approved 
Tech's Board of Directors iencg in . positions ranging 

'Saturday approved establish- from publisher to printer on 

ment of a master of arts de- numerous publications. He 

gree in journalism, pending has written 12 books and has 
approval of the action by the contributed to Editor and 
Coordinating Board, Texas   

Colleges and University Sys- 
tern. 

The Board also announced L. 
the hiring of Dr. Charles L. 
Allen, director Of the depart-

ment of journalism at Okla-

homa State University, effec-
tive Sept. '1. 

ALLEN WILL handle the 
graduate phase of Tech's jour-
nalism program. He has 
taught and held administra-
tive positions at Northwest-

ern, Rutgers, University of 
Illinois, and University of 
North Dakota. 

The new Tech professor has 
had wide professional exper- 

WHO 

IS 

LISSY? 

The marvLou5 
, tura'. 

navy 
on. wHite„. 

aNcL OtHer35. 



MERIT AWARDS — M. L. Penington, vice 
president for business affairs irighti, pre-
sents D. I. Davis, custodian (left) and Dr. 
F. L. Mize, head of the management de- 

padrneilt, certificates of merit for service 
to Tech. Davis and Mize are retiring from 
active service. 

I 00D SERVICE 

Al) ISORY COUNCIL 

The Food Service Advisory 
Council will conduct an open 
meeting at 7:30 p.m. today in 
the Housing Office conference 
MOM. 

a a * 

"DIE BUDDENBROOKS" 
The International Interest 

Committee of the Tech Union 
will present part two of "Die 
Buddenbrooks" today in the 
Coronado Room. 

Admission is free for the 
7:30 p.m. performance. 

* 	* 	* 
INTERNATIONAL CLUB 

The Tech International Club 
will have a picnic at Buffalo 
Lakes at the picnic table area 
at 4 p.m. Saturday. For res-
ervations call professor Karl 
Wuersching at SW 5-8921. All 
reservations must be made 
by 4 p.m. Wednesday. 

* 	* 
CATHOLIC STUDENT 

CENTER 
The Catholic Student Center 

will begin its spring calendar 
with a trip to Palo Duro Can-
yon Saturday, April 15. The 
trip will include a cookout 
with steaks and potatoes fur-
nished for $1.25 a head. Rides 
will leave the Center at 9 
a.m., 10 a.m. and noon. Resr-
vations for food may be made 
by calling the Center, P02-
1909. 

The Center will sponsor a 
dance April 21 at the Knights 
of Columbus Lodge. Tickets 
are $1 per couple, 75 cents 
stag and $1.50 at the door. Re-
freshments will be supplied 
and the band will be an-
nounced later. 

The dance is open to all 
Tech students. 

OPAL'S WESTERN 
WEAR 

"A complete line 
of Western Wear 

for the entire family" 

P02-8432 
1110 Ave. K 

Located between Pionee 
Hotel and Picadilly 

THE IN TOWN INN 
BARBER SHOP 

Main & Ave. K 

Professional: 
• Hair Straightening 
• Hair Coloring 
• Styling 
• Regular Cuts 

Toilet Articles: 
• Cliffcut Spray 
• Jels 

FOR APPOINTMENT 
Phone P024287 

tower of Pizza 
Home of fte, Foods 

Now Serving American 
Lunch, 	Family 	Style 

Choice of Meat or Fish 

$1.00 
2411 Main Street 

We Deliver 	 P03-3393 

MARCY CLEANERS 
6 Locations 

• Town & Country 	• 4445 — 34th 

• Tech Village Center 	• 6407 College 

(2904-4th) 

• Family Park 	 • 412 Ave. L 

20% DISCOUNT . . . 
on reg. dry cleaning price with Tech I. D. 

• No extra charge for I day service 

• Fast efficient laundry service 

• Expert alterations 

SOLITAIRE 
DIAMOND 

RINGS 
stand alone 
in clarity, 

brilliance 
and cut 	1, 

Up *met Of lee (magi are 
worthy of par law What you 
sped Ike drily, en-tided sod 
cut of these &amends alas the 
riches of the extra precious 10-
karat gold settings, you'll know 
these rings are the choice of a 
lifetime- 

A $150 	B $200 C $300 
JEWELERS 

Briercroft Center — 5302 Ave. Q 

THE CENTURY HOUSE 
Lubbock's ECONOMY Apartments 

We Invite Comparison! We Welcome Your Inspection! 
We Offer: 

1. Low, Low, Monthly 	5. Walking Distance (3 
Rent (Why Pay More?) 	blocks from Downtown) 

2. All Utilities Paid by Us 	6. All Bachelor Apart- 
!. Ample Off-Street Park- 	ments Contain Refrig- 

ing 	 orators 
7. Washers & Dryers 
8. Weekly or Monthly 

1629 16th St. 	
Rates 

Call PO 3-7572 
(Just off Ave. Q) 

FOR YOUR READING 

LEISURE AND PLEASURE 

College News 

NOW HAS 

11 	 1 

DEATH OF A PRESIDENT 
THE TRUE BELIEVER 
ALL AYN RAND TITLES 
A STORY OF 0 
PEANUT BOOKS AND 

ACCESSORIES 
PARTY RECORDS 

Plus 
THOUSANDS OF OTHER INEXPENSIVE UNCUT, 
UNABRIDGED PAPERBACKS AND LUBBOCK'S 
LARGEST SELECTION OF MAGAZINES. OPEN 
8 TEL 10 DAILY FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE. 

College News 
Located Right Off Campus 

2921 MAIN 	 P024722 

Light as a crocus in the wind . . . 
the freshening Spring suit, 

the flowering cotton shell. The suit 
is Fortrel polyester and cotton, 

triple-buttoned, with military pockets. 

The sleeveless round-necked cotton shell, 

:uesday, April 11, 1967 
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University to establish 
campus research park 

would also have the opportuni-
ty to associate with university 
faculty. Also, the university 
could provide adjunct profes-
sorships for research employ. 
es and thereby gain the serv-
ices of noted specialists. 

Through the rsearch park. 
the university would receive 
many opportunities for part-
time employment of graduate 
students. 

Murray said Tech "already 
has the most costly ingredient 
of a research park, the land." 

THE LAND would be divid-
ed into lots and leased to the 
research organization. Tech 
would retain the right of final 
approval of landscaping and 
building architecture. 

The research organization 
would have the responsibility 
of building the structures, re-
cruiting personnel, and pro-
viding the equipment, funds, 
and research projects. 

Murray specified that the 
park would be limited to re-
search work, barring manu-
facturing, social, political, re-
ligious, and fraternal uses. 

Mize, Davis given 

Raider Roundup I 

The Tech Board of Direc-
tors Saturday approved a 
recommendation by President 
Grover E. Murray which 
would establish a research 
park at the university. 

The request will now be 
presented to the Texas Legis-
lature, which must authorize 
the use of university property 
for the project. Tentative 
plans call for a 150-acre plot 
north of 4th Street and west 
of Quaker Avenue, adjacent to 
Loop 289. 

MURRAY DESCRIBED a 
research park as a "gather-
ing of research facilities of 
other separate organizations 
such as firms, government 
agencies, foundations and as-
sociations." 

The benefits of the research 
park to the university and re-
search unit are countless. 

A research employe would 
be attracted to the facilities 
of the university research 
park and to those of the uni-
versity, such as libraries, 
computers, and academic at-
mosphere. 

THE RESEARCH employe 

THEOLOGY CLASSES 

Theology classes will take 
place from 7 p.m. to 8 p.m. 
Wednesday for the remainder 
of the semester. 

* * 	* 
TECH UNION 

Tech Union Hospitality Com-
mittee will sponsor a bridal 
style show at 7:30 p.m. Thurs-
day in Lubbock Municipal Au-
ditorium. Tech students will 
be modeling clothes from 
Hemphill-Wells. Admission is 
free. 

* * 	* 
COUNTERGUERRILLA 

CNIT 

The Tech Counterguerrilla 
Unit will meet at 6:30 p.m. 
today in room 22 of the So-
cial Science Building for a 
critique of Saturday's patrol, 
and a lecture on weapons. 

* * 	* 
ARNOLD AIR SOCIETY 

The Arnold Air Society will 
meet at 8:30 p.m. today in 
room 113 of the Social Science 
Building. 

* * 
ALPHA PHI OMEGA 

Alpha Phi Omega will meet 
at 7:30 p.m. today in room 
101 of the Chemistry Building. 

* * 	• 
BSU 

Dr. Mary Brewer, professor 
of English, will speak at the 
Baptist Student Union noon 
forum Wednesday. She will 
speak on "The Christian In-
fluence on Literature." 

Reservations for lunch must 
be made by noon Tuesday by 
calling P03-8263. 

* a a 
HOME EC BANQUET 

There will be a Home Eco-
nomic Banquet Wednesday at 
6:30 p.m. in the Tech Union 
Ballroom. Dean Tinsley will 
speak on education abroad. 

All Horne Economics stu-
dents and ex-students may 
pick up tickets in the Home 
Economics Building. 

NO ONE ELSE HAS A 

COY 
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Two Tech faculty members 
have been awarded certifi-
cates of merit for their "dedi-
cated, honest, and faithful 
service," to the University. 

DR. F. L. MIZE, head of the 
department of management, 
and D. I. Davis, assistant su-
pervising custodian, were pre-
sented the awards by Marshall 
Pennington, vice president for 
business affairs, and Charles 
Libby, director of building op-
erations at a small ceremony 
last week. 

"Both of these men were 

Approximately 130 Tech 
student leaders left at noon 
Friday for the annual Board 
of Student Organizations 
(BSO) retreat at Bishop's 
Lodge in Santa Fe. N.M. 

Dr. Joseph W. Hollis, a pro-
fessor at Ball State Universi-
ty in Munice, Ind., spoke at a 
Friday night banquet concern-
ing leadership roles and the 
goals of group dynamics. 

TECH STUDENTS spent the 
weekend in discussion groups, 
taking time off Saturday af-
ternoon for a trip to Santa 
Fe. They returned to Tech 
Sunday at 9 a.m. -  

recognized for their work with 
the physical facilities, yet in 
different capacities," said 
Libby. "Davis retired last Fri-
day, and Mize will retire next 
Month. We wanted to honor 
these men before they left 
Tech." 

-DAVIS WAS ALSO present-
ed with a gift and a check in 
recognition for his 11 years of 
service to Tech. He came to 
the college in 1957 and worked 
his way up to the staff posi-
tion of second assistant super-
vising custodian. 

AWS President Genelyn 
Cannon said the discussion 
groups met informally and 
concentrated on getting to 
know each other. 

"More emphasis was placed 
on having group leaders draw 
out others to talk than on the 
qualities of leadership as 
such," said Miss Cannon. 

SUSAN CHILDS, San An-
tonio junior, said it wasn't un-
til the retreat was over that 
she really understood all that 
Hollis had been trying to say. 

Miss Childs said that they 
had all gone seeking specific 
answers to individual prob-
lems. 

"But we didn't learn the 
specifies," she said. "We 
learned that we can get to 
know and understand ourself 
only through a general yet 
thorough understanding of 
other people. That's the key 
to group dynamics."  

certificates 
"Davis checked the various 

buildings for need of repair 
and worked with the foremen 

-in carrying out maintenance 
policy," Libby said. "He 
worked well in his position 
and added much to the phy-
sical facilities." 

Mize, with 21 years of serv-
ice, was singled out for his 
part in developing the man-
agement department as well 
as technical advice given to 
the plant facilities. 

In 1950 Mize was instru-
mental in the creation of a 
management department sep-
arate from the then, depart-
ment of economics and man-
agement. 

"AT THAT TIME we had 
one instructor for the 42- ma-
jors. Today there are over 700 
majors with 13 full-time and 
19 teaching assistants planned 
for next fall," said Mize. 

Over the years, he has re-
ceived various certificates and 
awards from national organi-
zations. Sigma Iota Epsilon 
honored him with a plaque for 
his contribution to the profes-
sion of management. This is 
the national honorary and pro-
fessional management frater-
nity. 

THE BUILDING OPERA-
tions director, Libby, also rec-
ognized Mize for his advice 
and lectures given to the phy-
sical facilities. "The tapes of 
his lectures are still used for 
our management trainee and 
job arrangement," he said. 

Both men plan to hang their 
foot-square, hand-lettered cer-
tificates in their homes and 
concentrate on the leisure 
time of retirement. 

Dr. Dale W. Zinn has been 
named head of Tech's animal 
husbandry department, Dr. 
Gerald W. Thomas, dean of 
the School of Agriculture, an-
nounced Saturday. 

Zinn has served as acting 
head of the department since 
June, 1966. His new appoint-
ment is effective June 1. 

Three Tech students are 
among the 48 students from 
campuses all over the state 
selected for the 1967 Texas 
Baptist Student Summer Mis-
sions Program. 

They are Ernie Cowger, 
Mike Watts, and Wanda Su-
chiu. 

MISS SItCHIU, a Lubbock 
junior home economics major, 
will work on the Rio Grande 
Valley Project. Her work in 
the anti-poverty program will 
range from conducting Bible 
schools to holding health clin-
ics in villages along the river. 

Cowger, a senior sociology 

JOURNALISM 
STAFF POSITIONS 

Applications for staff po-
sitions on The University 
Daily and La Ventana are 
available in the student 
publications business of-
fice, room 102 of the Jour-
nalism Building. 

Deadline for returning 
applications is April 18. 
Students must have a 2.0 
g.p.a. for the previous se-
mester to be eligible. 

The Tech stage band placed 
high in the jazz competition 
at the Intermountain Jazz 
Festival in Salt Lake City dur-
ing the weekend. 

STAGE BAND director Joel 
Leach said although specific 
placings below the winner 
were not given, the Texas 
Tech group easily placed in 
the top three. 

The University of Nevada 
stage band won the competi- 

TRY A COY 
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THE WEST VIRGLNIA na-
tive holds two degrees fruni 
the University of West Vir-
ginia and has completed all 
requirements for the Ph.D in 
animal husbandry at the Uni-
versity of Missouri. 

"Dale is certainly one of the 
outstanding scientists in the 
meats industry," Thomas 

major from Stamford, will 
work this summer with a 
team of young missionaries to 
establish Baptist Student Un-
ions on campuses in Texas. 
Next year he will attend 
Frostberry College in Mary-
land on a 52,000 fellowship 
grant and serve as the B.S.U. 
director there. 

WATTS WILL WORK along 
with 11 other missionaries to 
build a church in a Wisconsin 
work camp. He is a junior 
from San Antonio. 

The Summer Missions Pro-
gram is financed entirely by 
student contributions. Twenty 
thousand dollars will be raised 
by the Texas Baptist students 
for this summer's program. 
The Tech Baptist students' 
goal is $1,967. 

The Texas student mission-
aries attended an orientation 
session this past weekend ai 
Mt. Lebanon in Dallas. 

THE PROGRAM is sending 
students to eight foreign coun-
tries and seven states this 
summer to work in vacation 
Bible schools, youth camps, 
retreats, work camps, and to 
do social work.  

said. "Ile has demonstrated 
his ability in teaching, re-
search and administration. We 
feel fortunate in having him 
accept this important position 
because animal husbandry is 
one of our most important 
subject matter areas," 

The university's animal hus-
bandry department is the 
largest in the School of Agri-
culture and one of the larger 
departments in the nation. 
More than 320 undergraduates 
currently are enrolled at Tech. 

Zinn, 37, is the author of 
more than 40 scientific and 
technical papers. He joined 
the Tech faculty in 1961 after 
serving as assistant professor 
of animal husbandry at New 
Mexico State University. 

ZINN'S MEMBERSHIP in 
professional societies includes 
the American Meat Science 
Association, the American So-
ciety of Animal Science, the 
American Association for the 
Advancement of Science, the 
Society of Sigma Xi, Ameri-
can Institute of Biological 
Science, and the Southern Sec. 
lion of Food Technologists. 

He is on the board of direc-
tors of the Lubbock Agricul-
tural Club and St. John's 
Methodist Church. 

AT TECH, he has coached 
the meats judging team and 

DALE W. ZINN 

-lnimal husbandry department 

Zinn named head 

130 attend retreat 

SINGLE STUDENTS! 
LARGE INTERNATIONAL FIRM NOW HIRING FOR SUMMER 

PROGRAM. GUIDANCE AND TRAINING IN MARKETING, SALES 

PROMOTION, AND CREDIT. 

THROUGH TRAINING OFFERED IN LUCRATIVE FIELDS FOR 

THOSE WHO QUALIFY. 

CALL MR. JIM McDONALD 	SH4-4013 

9 A.M.-12 NOON MONDAY THRU FRIDAY 

Three Tech students 
to serve in missions 

Stage band places high 
tion and an all-expense paid 
trip to Miami Beach where it 
will compete in the national 
finals. 

TECH was the only stage 
band chosen from Texas to 
attend the regional finals. 

Tenor saxophonist Don Cald-
well of the Tech band was has directed the meats inch's-
mentioned as one of the out- try program. He teaches grad-
standing soloists at the meet, ing and classification of meat 
in which seven bands partici- animals and meat processing 
pated. and merchandising. 



IT LOOKS LIKE TROUBLE —Tom Sawyer 1181 sees nothing 
but trouble ahead as a big defensive rush comes at him 
during the first scrimmage gorse of the Red Raiders spring 
training season. The Whites won the first game, dump- 

ing the Reds 17-7. The Raiders will be in action again 
Saturday as the Reds and Whites will square off at 
2 p.m. in Jones Stadium. 

Philadelphia 

buys Francona 
PHILADELPHIA )API  

The Philadelphia Phillies 
without a regular first 
baseman since Bill White 
injured his foot during the 
winter, announced Monday 
that they have purchased 
first baseman Tito Fran-
cone from the St. Louis 
Cardinals. 

The amount of money in-
volved in the straight cash 
deal was not disclosed by 
the Phillies, who have been 
using former second base-
man Tony Taylor at first 
base all spring. 

SPORTS 
Red Raider greenmen 
host Longhorns today 

imsliossounalliemmig 

Tech Student Special  ■ 
Dry Cleaning 

10% discount off $2.00 order 
or inure 

+ COUPON + 
Must accompany incoming order 

707 College 
Coupon Per Customer 

Offer good through Monday, 	I 
April 17th 

111111.1•111MINIXI•MUSI ■J 

DAPPeRDAti 
cl.eAtICR$ 

1_010: tAtOg 
INNI Nem mi 

ffThe 
APARTMENT 

FINDERS° 
A FREE SERVICE 3 lUBBOCI I 

TIRED OF LOOKING? 
Why spend days looking for a 
place to live when you could call 
Apartment Finders and let them 
do the work! NO CHARGE to you 
for this service and we have Sat 

I what you want in a home. n- 
spected and approved apartments 
and houses . . SIN= 550 to 
5500. 
de FURNISHED OR UNFURN- 

ISHED 	/a ALL linens 
• ALL PRICES is ALL TYPES 

ih FREE SERVICE: 

All Correspondrnoe Answered 

lee lath Pt re. 

SW 5-7114 

Now! CAMARO PACESETTER SALE! 

Camaro's lower;wider,heavier,roomier,  

than any other car at its price. And starting today, 

there's another reason to buy right away : 

specially equipped Camaros at special savings. 

You get all this : the big 155-hp Six, 

de luxe steering wheel and extra interior trim, 

wheel covers, whitewalls, bumper guards, front and rear, 

wheel opening moldings and body side striping. 

NO EXTRA COST! 
Now, during the sale, the special hood stripe 

and floor-mounted shift for the 3.speed transmission 
are available at no extra cast! 

See your Chevrolet denier now and soya! 

  

GM 
CA,4AFIO CHOSEN 19h7 INDIANAPOLIS 500 PACE CAR 

 

  

APRIMINO 

/AraMi 19.  

STARTS TODAY I 	 1 (DA 
The Slave 1.00, 3,45, 6:30 I 	IRO 	 6fol 

9:25 	
Vai 32/1 

 '7'I lit 

:ompanion 2:15, 500, 7:45 	 rwel 
I= Open All Day Tuesday I  um., 11111 

Jean-Pierre Cassef-Annie 	C1 
Giradot-Sondra Milo -- 

PHILIPPE DE BROCA 	
4:•"0. 

Color 

THERE ARE MANY KINDS OF slave.. 
NOT AU Of THEM WANT TO BE FREE. 

COVriNfebtral 
Ci*-na 

MILTALlea 

For Those Who Want 
the Best 

Nu - Way Automatic 
Laundry 

Plenty of Soft, Hot Water 
4202 19th 

For those who want 
the best service 

Rain or Shine Auto. 
Laundry 

Plenty of Soft, Hot Water 
2312 Clovis Rd. 

4 	* 	The University Daily 	* Tuesday, April II, 1967 

Tech baseballers hit a slump; 
drop three in a row to Lobos 

Bronx Bombers drop 
Washington by 6-0 

WASHINGTON AP) — The Elston Howard scored Pepi-
New York Yankees, showing tone on a single to right, and 
signs of their famous past, ex- Charlie Smith beat out a hit 
plotted for seven runs in the to third baseman McMullen. 

third inning and right-hander AFTER Horace Clarke flied 

Mel Stottlemyre pitched a to center, John Kennedy, ac-
two-hitter Monday as the quired from the Los Angeles 
Bronx Bombers crushed the Dodgers, doubled down the 
Senators 8-0 in the 1967 Ameri- right field line, scoring How-
can League opener before and and Smith. 
President Johnson. 	 Stottlmyre singled off relief 

Stottlemyre, a 20-game loser pitcher Darold Knowles to 
last year, allowed only an in- score Kennedy. 
field single by Cap Peterson 	In the seventh inning, Elston 
before Fred Valentine led off Howard hit his first home run. 
the ninth with a ground single 
teright field. 

fiy by Ken McMullen to Bill 
Robinson in right. The Yankee By ASSOCIATED PRESS a day game in New York 

hurler struck out six. and 	Baltimore and Pittsburgh where the 1967 breed of Mets' 

walked two. 	 start the job of living up to fans are due to turn out 45,000 

The Yankees, who finished the pre-season pennant picks flan 
strong to see the latest addi- 

of the marvelous ones. in the cellar last season, teed Tuesday as the big league 

off early on Washington's teams complete their two-day Don Cardwell, an ex-Pirate 
starting pitcher, Pete Reich- opening program. 	 who was critical of the man- 
ert, who was 14-15 during 	If the weatherman is . kind agernent for not pitching him 
1966. 	. ... 	. 	_ 	 . 

from coast to coast, a total of more often last year, gets a 
about 245,000 will watch the chance to get even. He will be 
Tuesday program of four day opposed by Bob Veale, the 
games and four night games. Pirates' ace. 

HANK BAUER'S Orioles, THE BUCS have a stand 
who have been shouting, pat line-up plus Maury Wills, 
"We're No. 1" since they but the Mets will have rookie 
knocked off the Dodgers in Don Bosch in center, ex-Card 
four straight, will send Dave Jerry Buchek at second, Bud 
McNally, their World Series Harrelson at short, ex-Dodger 
opener, against Jim Kaat, Tommy Davis in left and ex-
Minnesota's 25-game winner, outfielder Ron Swoboda on 
in an afternoon game at Bal- first. 
timore. 	 The pitching name of the 

The Orioles have a set line- opening schedule figures to be 
up, and the Twins' most ins- th e night game at gt .  Lou is 

 portant addition, pitcher Dean where Juan Marichal, the San 
Chance, isn't slated to see ac- 
tion. About 40,000 are expect- 
ed. 

PITTSBURGH also will play 
BOY does COY 

table Gaud 

l_O MTii v INN 
ma 15k, 

TOM TRESII doubled down 
the third base line in the third 
and rookie Bill Robinson, ac-
quired from Atlanta in a trade 
fur Clete Boyer during the off-
season, hit the first homer of 
the season some 380 feet into 
the left-center field Yankee 
bullpen. 

Mickey Mantle, making his 
debut as a first baseman, sin-
gled to left, and Joe Pepitone, 
who exchanged places with 
Mantle in center, tripled to 
left field, scoring Mantle. 

MANTLE, however, aggra-
vated a leg muscle he injured 
March 22 and was taken out 
at the game. 

CINCINNATI IAP) — Vada 
Pinson and Deron Johnson 
cracked first inning home 
runs and Dick Simpson fol-
lowed with a pinch homer in 
the seventh to give the Cin-
cinnati Reds a 6-1 victory over 
the Los Angeles Dodgers in 
the National League opener 
Monday. 

Big Jim Maloney held the 
Dodgers to five hits over the 
first seven innings to earn the 
victory before a packed crowd 
of 28,422 in the traditional opl 

Francisco Giants' 25-6 per-

former of last year, will take 

on Bub Gibson, who was 21-12 

for the Cards. 

THE CARDS will have Rog-

er Marts in right field and 
Mike Shannon on third base in 
major moves_The Giants'. on-
ly change will be Ken Hender-
son in right. About 35,000 fans 
will be on hand. 

By GARY TILOIll 
Sports Writer 

ALBUQUERQUE — Passably 
the only good thing the Texas 
Tech Red Raider baseball 
team got out of their 625 mile 
round this past weekend was 
some good Mexican food. 

The Raiders ended their one 
game winning streak as they 
dropped three games to the 
University of New Mexico Lo-
bos 5-3, 4-3, and 9-4. 

THE RAIDERS now own a 
4-13 record and have lost six 
of their last seven ball games. 
The Lobos arc 16-10 and have 
won eight of their last nine 
games. The Lobos also hold a 
9-3 series edge over the Raid-
er:3. 

The Raiders had a chance 
to win the second game of a 
doubleheader Friday. Leading 
2-1 going into the bottom of 
the sixth inning, a throwing 
error by shortstop John Mc-
Intyre allowed the Lobos to 
pick up three unearned runs 

ener at Crosley Field. After 
Maloney left for a pinch hit-
ter, Ted Abernathy worked the 
last two innings. 

PINSON and Johnson quick-
ly jumped on Dodger starter 
Bob Miller for homers to give 
the Reds all they needed. Both 
blows ended up in the right-
field bleachers. 

Pinson picked on a 2-1 pitch, 
and one out later, Johnson 
blasted another Miller pitch 
into the stands. Miller, moved 
from the. bullpen to take over 
the retired Sandy Koufax's 
spot in the starting rotation, 
gave up five home runs in all 
of 1966. 

MILLER was taken out in 
the fifth inning for a pinch 
hitter, and his reliever, Ran 
Perronoski gave up the bonier 
to Simpson in the seventh, 

The Reds got to anther for 
two more hits and another run 
in the second inning, with Ma-
loney aiding his own cause. 
Catcher John Edwards sin-
gled, went to third on a sin-
gle by Maloney and scored on 
Tommy Harper's fly ball to 
center.  

and steal the victory away 
from the Raiders. 

ALL THINGS weren't on the 
dark side for the Raiders. Jim 
Montgomery had a solo homer 
in the third inning of the first 
game and a double in the sec-
ond game. Also in the second 
game, McIntyre connected for 
a round tripper in the sevenths 
inning, but the tally was one 
run short of tying the game. 

In the third game Saturday, 
it was "bud day at black 
rock" its the Lobos pounded 

Courtnen 
downed by 
Bears, 4-2 

The Baylor Bears made a 
clean sweep of the double's 
play to capture a 4-2 confer-
ence tennis win over the Tech 
Red Raiders Saturday. 

The two teams had split 2-2 
in the singles match play. But 
the Bears bounced back as 
Lloyd Carll and Bill Bane took 
Rudy Gutierrez and Mike Far-
rish 6-8, 6-2, 8-6 to win the 
final doubles play. 

IN THE singles match play, 
Mike Beene downed Carll 
6-2, 6-4; Farrish bested Bane 
6-3, 6-4; John Phelps, Baylor, 
defeated Gutierrez 10-8, 3-6, 
6-4; Chip Meyers, Baylor, 
whipped Pat Acton 3-6, 6-3, 
8-6. 

In the other doubles match, 
Phelps and Meyers defeated 
Beene and Murphy Yates 
57, 6-4, 6-3. 

THE LOSS gives the Raid-
ers a 1-1 conference mark and 
a 6-6 for the season. The 
Beam stand 2-0 in conference 
play and 9-3 for the season. 

The Raider's next match 
will be with Texas A&M here 
Saturday. 

Hockey stars 
play tonight 

Texas Tech's best will meet 
the Lubbock senior team in 
the intramural all-star ice 
hockey game today at 7:15 
p.m. at Iceland Skating Rink. 

Representing Tech's five 
intramural hockey teams will 
be: John Kidder, Bill Wilson, 
Leo Lowery, Ray Carrell, 
John Morley, Steve Wells, Tim 
Veneciano, Mike Merrit, Don 
Shipman, Mike Glenn, Doug 
Foster, Doti Shepard and 
Mike Cavanaugh.  

out 11 hits, seven for extra 
bases. The Lobos got four 
triples, two in the first inning, 
and three doubles. 

FOR THE Raiders, in the 
second game, Don Champion 
had a double and Ralph 
"small man" Cox hit a two-
run homer in the eighth, pull-
ing the Raiders to within two 
runs, 6-4. of the Lobos. But 
New Mexico added three more 
in the bottom half of the 
inning for the 9-4 margin of 

The Texas Tech golfers will 
be aiming to break the .500 
mark today, but the going 
may be a little tough as they 
host the Southwest Conference 
favorite University of Texas 
at Austin in a dual confer-
ence match at Lubbock Coun-
try Club. 

The Raiders are 1-1 in con-
ference play, owning a 5-1 win 
over Rice and a 5,441/2 loss 
to Texas A&M, for a 5%-61/2 
conference point total for the 
season. 

Texas has won its only con-
ference match of the youm, 
season, na-MA over the Uni-
versity of Arkansas. 

Coach Gene (Butch) Mitch-
ell Jr. plans to use Robert 
McKinney, Jimmy Wilcoxson, 
Ronnie White and Jim Arnold 
in today's match with The 
Longhorns. 

Coach George Hannons' 
Texas team is led by Mason 
Adkins, defending Southwest 

STEAK FRY 

The Catholic Student Center 
is sponsoring a steak fry Fri-
day at Palo Duro Park. Tick-
ets are $1.25 per person, and 
transportation will leave the 
Catholic Student Center at 9 
a. it. , 10 a.m. and noon.  

victory. 
Not only did the Raiders 

lose the series but they lost 
the services of hard hitting 
left fielder Jerry Kolander. 
Kolander twisted his right 
knee in the first game Friday 
and will be out for one or two 
weeks. 

IT WAS one of the Raider's 
more devastating weekend ex-
cursions as they collected only 
18 hits while committing U 
errors. 

Conference individual chant-
pion. 

Last Spring, the 'Horns 
downed Tech 4% -l% and fin-
ished third in the conference 
with 24-18 point record, just 
one away from champion 
Baylor. 

The Raiders finished sev-
enth in the conference play 
last season with 17%-24 ,h. 

Tee-off time for today's 
match is 10 a.m. 

Raiders sign 

N.M. all-star 
Mike Oaks, a 6-5 post man 

from Albuquerque Valley, 
New Mexico, was announced 
as Texas Tech's fourth bas-
ketball signee, by assistant 
Coach Charlie Lynch this past 
weekend. 

Oaks was a two-time New 
Mexico all-stater and led his 
team to the runner-up spot in 
the state tournament. As a 
senior, he averaged 16 points 
per game. 

COY 7D5ELUXE 

COU070,TRY55,,,INN 

StBottlIterryiEe aVlsaolearlit'on■evesd only Flag chasers play today one ball out of the infield, a 

Collins Radio Company, Dallas, Texas, 

and Cedar Rapids, Iowa, will be interviewing 

at Texas Tech on Wednesday, April 12. 

We are interested in Graduates in Mathe-

matics who would like a career as Computer 

Programmers. 

Please come by the Placement Service of-

fice to set up an interview for Wednesday, 

April 12. 

COLLINS RADIO CO. 
An Equal Opportunity Lauded.. 

Yanks, Reds win openers 
* 	* 

Cincinnati Reds dump 
Dodgers on homeruns 
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