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Am y Brown Crowned 1990 
GHS H  omecoming Queen

Queen Candidates, left to right-Jolee Burger, Shannon Fields, Less Sweatt, Amy 
Brown and Sharolyn Chandler

Tigers Beat Cotton Center, 
Lightning Stops Game

G r o o m ’s  H o m e c o m in g  
g a m e a ga in st C otton C enter

“ Night of Dreams" was 
the theme of Homecoming 
1990. The evening’s 
activities began with 
assembly of the Fighting 
Tiger Band under the direc­
tion of Andrea Payton on the 
football field. As the queen 
candidates circled the field 
in convertibles on loan from 
Chamberlain Motor Co. of 
Clarendon, the band played 
"Say You. Say Me.”  Crown 
bearer was Cody Bivins, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Mark 
Bivins. Presenting the 
Oueen’s bouquet of roses 
was Krissanne Davis, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Mrs. Gary Davis. Ushers 
were Katonia Meaker, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Meaker, escorted by 
Robert Miller, son of Judy 
Miller; and Sherrie 
Weinheimer, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. James Wein­
heimer was escorted by Nick 
Kuehler. son of Mr. and Mrs 
Kuehler.

C an d id ates m ade their  
entrance on the field which 
had been decorated by 
student council with a 
triad of white archways and 
red and black balloons. 
Steve Hutsell, Groom High 
resident MC announced the 
girls, their accomplishments

and their escorts. They were 
Senior Sharolyn Chandler, 
escorted by Bronte Britten; 
Senior Shannon Fields, 
escorted by Justin Harris; 
Junior Lesa Sweatt, escorted 
by Brian Baker; and Sopho­
more Amy Brown, escorted 
by Bruce Britten.

The winner . .  .Sophomore 
Amy Brown) she is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe David Brown and grand­
daughter of Mrs. Nancy 
Blackwell and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Brown of Amarillo. Amy 
is involved in FHA and 
newspaper staff. Amy said, 
“ I was so surprised I 
couldn’t even think, finally 
Bruce said, “ Come on let’s 
go!”

The Queen was, after a try 
or two, was crowned with a 
“ Diamond”  Tiara and 
presented with a dozen red 
roses. Then the moment that 
always gets a response from 
the crowd. . .the kiss! From 
this reporter’s vantage point 
it looked  to  b e  a very sw eet, 
maybe a little em b arrassed , 
almost brotherly peck on 
the cheek.

The Queen and her court 
were then serenaded by 
Melanie Britten’s beautiful 
rendition of "Wind beneath 
my wings.”

Melanie was accompanied 
by Leslie Crowell.

The current generation at 
GHS seems to be one for 
breaking traditions. This 
coronation is the second to 
be held on the football field 
instead of the auditorium. 
They felt it unifies the spirit 
of Homecoming. They also 
broke tradition again this 
year by choosing a Queen 
who was not a senior. We 
must be raising individuals 
who are not limited to what 
has always been but willing 
to try something different.

Before the game began, 
football team members paid 
tribute to their mothers by 
giving them a single red 
rose. Mothers feel every 
bruise and bump that the 
boys get. One mother said 
she always holds her breath 
as boys unpile from a play to 
see if he (her son) get up. 
Another mom said its hatd 
for her to enjoy the game 
when all she can think about
is the grass stains that kids 
are putting on their uniform! 
It’s truly a wonderful thing 
when the boys take a 
moment to say thanks.

Congratulations Tigers, 
Queen candidates and 
Queen Amy Brown on a very 
successful Homecoming.

ended 30 seconds before 
halftime due to lightning. 
Rain plagued the game 
almost from the kick off. 
Brian Baker and Robert

M iller each  scored  2 touch ­
d ow n s. B aker had a 40  yard  
punt return. G room  had a 
total of 123 yards rushing 
compared to Cotton Centers 
minus 4. Groom’s passing 
game was nonexistent while 
the Elks gained 45 yards.

G room  did very w ell on  
fumbles, recovering twice. 
The Tiger’s led in penalties 
20 to the Elks 5.

Groom Tigers travel to 
Amherst this Friday. Game­
time is 7:30 p.m.

Girls St age Powder Puff Game

Powder Puff Cheerleaders-Kurtie Webb, Roberta Miller,
Pauline McLaughlin

Voter Registration Continues

Homecoming, like Groom 
Day. seems to get bigger 
and better every year. This 
year’s events began on 
Tuesday night with a 
student council fund raiser, 
“ Powder Puff” Football. 
Teams were made up of 
seniors and freshmen versus 
sophomores and juniors. 
The teams were coached by 
Mike Conrad and Brian 
Baker. Coach Conrad (sr’s 
and fish) stated that he was 
surprised at how well they 
ran offensive plays. He also 
cited Shannon Fields and 
Katonia Meaker as his star 
players. Conrad’s career 
interest has always been in 
the direction of coaching. He 
said. “ It was fun.” When 
asked if this experience 
would make him consider 
a field in coaching girls 
instead of boys, he said, 
"No, girls fight too much!” 

Coach for the other team 
was Brian Baker (soph's and 
j r ’s). Designating Lesa 
Sweatt. Marie Conrad and 
Kristi Case as star players. 
Coach Baker said "It was 
lots of! Of course we won!" 
Like any game that wins, it 
will be debated for months 
by coffee shop quarterbacks. 
(Was it skill or a bad call by

referees’ Lamb and 
Branch?) When asked if he 
had any aspirations to 
become a coach after this 
experience. Baker said.

“ Well it might be fun!” 
When questioned about the 
ability of girls compared to 
boys . . ."Boys are faster 
than girls . . .  but with pads .

Justine Harris and seated

. .1 think they would give you 
a run for you’re money.” 

The final score. Srs-Fish 
12; Soph-Jrs 18.

There is still time to 
register to vote in November 
elections. Registrations 
must be postmarked no later 
than October 8th for new 
voters. Absentee voting will 
begin on October 17th and 
continue through November 
2nd. Ballots can be request­
ed by mail through October 
30th. They must be returned 
by election day in order to be 
counted.

Voters in Carson County

Used Book sale-Oct 5, 
3:00 - 5:00 p.m.. Oct. 6, 
10:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon at 
Community Center. Friends 
of the Library.

Carson County 4-H
Achievement Banquet will 
be at 6:30 p.m. on Saturday, 
October 13 at the Catholic 
School.

Country Neighbors Club 
will meet at 10 a.m. on 
Wednesday, Oct. 10th in the 
home of Mrs. Roy Ritter.

will be asked to make 
decisions between Donita 
Herber, Democrat Candi­
date, and Rosalyn Watson, 
write-in candidate, for Tax 
Assessor-Collector. All other 
candidates of local interest 
are running uncontested.

The county clerk’s office is 
open Monday through 
Friday from 8:00 a.m. to 
5:00 p.m. closed during the 
noon hour.

Game Nlght-Thursday,
October 11th, Community 
Center at 6:30 p.m.

TUESDAY GRAIN PRICES 
AT LOCAL ELEVATORS

cash prices on grain 
posted at grain elevators 
serving the Groom area 
Tuesday afternoon: 

Wheat-$2.23 
Milo-S3.50 
Corn-$3.80

rCommunity Calendar
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CARD OF THAI IKS

Many thanks to ill those 
who helped us put Home­
coming together. Special 
thanks to Linda Fie ds and 
the Booster Club fa  every- 
things they did.

The GHS: itudent
Council

Bessie Mae Arnold visited 
her niece in Claud e last 
week.

Helen Witt returned home 
Sunday night from a visit in 
English and Alto, Texas. 
Lynell Peek and son, Brent, 
took her to Alto Friday 
where they attended the 
Alto versus Groveton game. 
Though Alto scored first, 
was ahead at the half, and 
had the most yards rushing, 
Groveton scored in the last 
two minutes to win the 
game. Helen remained in 
Alto until Sunday visiting 
Jay. Melody and Rheagan 
Witt.

Essie C. Knowles received 
news Sunday night at 10:30 
p.m. that her youngest 
grandson. Kenny White of 
Wichita, KS., had a pick-up 
accident. He received major 
injuries and remains in 1CU 
awaiting surgery of a broken 
right leg and possible pelvic' 
repairs. Kenneth is the son 
of Dr. Vernon and Merilyn 
White.

Your prayers are 
requested.

Mrs. Mears recently 
returned from an extended 
visit with her family in 
California. She left on 
August 2nd.

Mrs. Mears and her late 
husband lived in the 
Lancaster area for 25 years, 
so in many ways it was like 
going home.

She visited four sisters, 
lots of nieces and nephews 
and many, many friends. 
While there, she was 
honored with a luncheon by 
a collegiate organization, to 
which she is a lifetime 
member, Women for 
Pepperdine College.

Mrs. Mears stated that 
she was also treated like 
visiting royalty at her old 
church.

CHOWUNE MENU

Oct. 5, Friday-Chicken
enchiladas, pinto beans, 
jello salad, com bread, 
dessert

Oct. 9, Tueaday-Turkey, 
dressing and gravy, sweet 
potatoes, cranberry sauce, 
dessert

S t a t f  N a t i o x a l  B a i

M E M B E R

FDK
G r o o m . T e x a s

• A . 248-7531

Nightin Gals met at the 
Bank on Sept. 25th at 7:00 
p.m. with hostesses, Delores 
Prather and Sybil Brown.

Games of pinochle were 
played with Shirley Lamber- 
son receiving high score and 
Mary Britten low.

R e f re s h m e n ts  w ere  
served to guest LaVesta 
Barnett and members Alice 
Britten, Evelyn Hubbart, 
Thelma Pool, Theresa Wills, 
Sybil Harrell, Lula Wall, 
Nettie Fields, Veona Davis, 
Mary Lee Friemel, Lucille 
Case, Pearl Banks, Mary 
Britten and Shirley 
Lamberson.

Months were drawn as 
follows: Oct. Veona Davis 
and Lucille Case; November 
Wynona Koetting and 
Evelyn Hubbart; January 
Delores Prather and Mary 
Britten; Feb. Mary Lee 
Friemel and Lula Wall; Mar. 
Alice Britten and Thelma 
Pool; April Sybil Harrell and 
Theresa Wills: May Sybil 
B raw n  and Sh irley  Lamber­
son; June Nettie Fields and 
Pearl Banks.

LOCAL CONTACT 
NEEDED

The Old Route 66 Associa­
tion of Texas needs contacts 
from Groom and Conway, 
who are interested in form­
ing a local 66 chapter in this 
area. Earlier this year the 
Association contacted John 
Howard, who was very 
interested and felt that 
others would be interested 
also. He was to set up a 
presentation by the Associa­
tion, at the Lions Club 
meeting. I left on vacation 
and when I returned, I 
learned of John’s sudden 
death.

I feel John would want us 
to go right on, so if anyone is 
interested, please contact 
me at 806-779-3164, or 
write: Delbert Trew, Box A, 
Alanreed, Texas 79002.

We have chapters now in 
Shamrock, McLean and 
Amarillo and are meeting 
with the Adrian-Vega group 
next week. Local chapters 
remain independent and 
one-half of the dues collect­
ed remain with the local 
chapter. All details, along 
with a video are used in a 
presentation to any group 
interested. We welcome 
your participation and invite 
you to join the fastest grow­
ing Association around.

Jimmy and Zoah Britten 
and Debbie Haning visited 
Cole Britten in ICU at 
Northwest Texas Hospital in 
Amarillo Sunday. He was 
seriously hurt in a rodeo in 
Dumas Saturday. His 
parents are Larry and Nancy 
Britten of Canyon.

Christian Mothers

Christian Mothers began 
the year with a salad supper, 
Monday, Sept. 17th. The 
meeting was called to order 
by new president, Loretta 
Britten. The Holiday Bazaar 
was discussed. The bazaar 
will be November 17th from 
9:30-12:00 noon. There will 
be door prizes, stocking 
contest, booths and last b ut 
not least, stew and corn- 
bread. The convention was 
also discussed. The door 
prize was won by Waymuth 
Britten. Everyone who 
attended reported to have 
really enjoyeid the wonderful 
salads provided by every­
one.

The next Christian 
Mothers' meeting will be 
Oct. 22, in the home of Doris 
Homer. The hostesses are 
Sue Wills and Neysa 
Friemel.

W yn o n a  K o e tt in g , 
Mildred Burgin and Connie 
Stephenson spent the past 
week in Oshkosh,Wisconsin. 
Wynona attended her late 
husband’s Air Force 
Reunion.

A. J. Newsom 
Woter Well 

Service
Submeralble Pump* 

Aero motor Windmill*

Phone 248-7411

RGM AG & G, INC.

TAKE AIM TO FUTURE 
FINANCIAL SECURITY! -

BANK AT HOME!
We are ini erested in the welfare o f our local 

community and more responsive to local and 

individual needs than any out oftown financial 

in stitution could ever be!

Handling the 

financial needs 

o f Groom

fo r over 60  years. . . . .

Serving The Farmer’s  

Needs First!

Herbicides and 

Custom Application

Futl Line O f Chemicals

AG cG R A IN  INC
248-7551

248-7575
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run around the bonfire. Right-Buck

Anthony explains what

GROOM ISD MENU

Oct. 8, Monday-Breakfast
cereal, blueberry muffins, 
juice, milk

Lunch, Steak fingers, 
mashed potatoes, gravy, 
green beans, hot rolls, 
milk.jello

Oct. 9, Tuesday-Breakfast 
Pancakes, peanut butter, 
syrup, juice, milk

Lunch. Burritos with chili 
and cheese, salad, picante 
sauce, applesauce, chips, 
milk

Oct. 10, Wednesday- 
Breakfast, scrambled eggs, 
toast, hash browns, juice, 
milk

Lunch, Cheeseburgers, 
french tries, pickles, onions, 
lettuce, tomatoes, 'buns, 
milk, brownies

Oct. 11, Thursday-Break­
fast. Bacon, biscuits, gravy, 
juice, milk

Lunch, Meat and cheese 
lasagne, fried okra, salad, 
bread sticks, milk, vanilla 
pudding with cookie

Oct. 12, Friday-School 
dismissed

Queen Amy and her Royal Coach The little Howard girls are 

ready to cheer

Groom

Hying Service

Craig Howard

All Types ofaerial applications 

Good Service-Reasonable Prices

SCOUTS RAISE FLAG 
FOR NINTH SEASON Harris & Office Craig

248-7561 248-7420
★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ * *

Girl Scouts and and Boy 
Scouts of Groom have 
always been known for their 
community service work. 
This year is the ninth 
consecutive season they 
have raised the flag at foot­
ball games. This year’s 
Daisy. Brownies and Junior 
girl Scouts were led by 
Sandra Britten, Karen 
Brown. Marcia Conrad and 
Donna Burton. Cub Scouts 
were directed by Debbie 
Anthony and Ralph 
Robinson. Flag bearer was 
Karen Conrad, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Donnie 
Conrad. Commanding the 
Color Guard was Evan 
Crowell, son of Mr and 
Mrs. Jerry Crowell. These 
scouts range in age from 5 tc 
11. Community service is 8 
large part of the scouting 
experience that teaches 
children the pleasure o! 
lending a helping hand 
pride in country, and ir 
themselves, to see a job wel 
done. Scouting builds bettei 
citizens for the future.

Second graders are ’gonna’ rock the field

FILLET STRIPS

Three great Country Baskets from Dairy Queen 
Golden-fried steak fingers. Juicy chicken 
strips made with whole white meat 
fillets. And fresh fillets of fish. Served ?
with french fries, a big slice of Texas \  
Toast, and thick, creamy country f i f f i j
gravy or tasty tartar sauce.
Try one today! s p
Sale Price October 1-21,1990 STEAK FINCERS

ON SALE IN<SEK0UNTRY
FILLET STRIPS

P -a



3

I

Page 4-THE GROOM NEWS 
Thursday. Oct >bcr4. 1990

Carolyn Carder, Gary Bohr

Announce Engagement
Mr. and Mrs. Earl T. 

Smith of .tO12 S. Havden 
announce the engagement of 
their daughter. Carolyn S. 
Carder, to Gary L. Bohr.

Bohr is the ‘.on of Mr. and 
Mrs. Williair R. Bohr of 
Groom.

The couple plans to he

wed Oct. 27 at St. Andrews 
Episcopal Church.

The bride-elect attended 
Amarillo College. She is 
employed bv Susanne's.

The prospective groom 
attended Clarendon College 
in Clarendon and AC. He is 
a sales representative for 
l ake Steel.

CITY BEGINS WORK 
ON WATER SYSTEM

Work began Monday on 
Groom’s water system by 
Utility Corporation of Lub­
bock. Thanks to a grant the 
water system is being 
modernized and updated. 
This should also make our 
fire insurance go down to 
some degree.

The first shovel of earth 
was removed by Mayor Al 
Homer at 1:22 p.m. at the 
S.F. corner of the park. On 
hand were city employees 
Don Case and Jack Barnett, 
gas company employee 
David Hinson, and a 
representative of General 
Telephone. Unless unfor-

CARD OF THANKS

Grandad loved this 
community for many years 
and all the kindness, love 
and support have come back 
to his grandchildren and 
families through your 
thoughtful concern.

We cherish our memories 
and are so thankful that he 
brought us all together.

The Family of Cecil Culver

CARD OF THANKS

My deepest thanks to all 
my concerned friends at the 
loss of my father. The 
flowers, cards and food were 
verv thoughtful of you and 
make our sadness a little 
easier to bear.

Toni Pavlovsky

seen difficulties occur all 
streets will be bored under 

so our nice new seal coating 
should not be disturbed.

Parents should remind 
children not to play in area 
where the men are working 
or riding bicycles aiong any 
open ditch area.

We will keep y ou updated 
on the progress as well as 
have some pictures next 
w eek.

Capt. Rusty Davis, Dis­
trict Supervisor of the 
Amarillo Highway Patrol 
District comprising of 31 
counties said. “ For the 
month of August, our 
troopers investigated seven 
fatal accidents. 68 personal 
injury accidents, and 96 
property damage accidents. 
There were nine persons 
killed and 104 persons

injured in these accidents.
Sgt. Timothy Thompson of 

Borger stated. “ In Carson 
County, our troopers investi­
gated one fatal accident, 
four personal injury 
accidents, and six property 
damage accidents in the 
month of August. One 
person was killed and eight 
persons were injured in 
these accidents.”

WHEELER-EVANS
ELEVATORS

Groom & Corner North 

We ore happy to be of service"

Phones: 248-7262 or 248-7278 

Corner 248-7011

N ad in e  Thornton
248-7359

Groom, Texas

Good Luck 

Groom Tigers
- VS-

AMHERST
There - 7:30 p.m. - Oct. 5

Bill & Sam's Enterprises 

Wieberg Welding

Attebury Grain, Inc. 

Blackwell Supply

We are behind you, Tigers 
Bivens' Automotive 

Wheeler Evans Elevators Co.
Bromley Insurance

Circle B Meat Co.
Yvonne's Beauty Shop

Vonnie & Karen

%
Mighty's 

i The Groom News

Stop-N-Shop

Pav's Service Station 

Jim & Donna Burton 

RGM Ag& Grain, Inc. 

Once Upon A Time ^

Tina's Hair Care-A-SelDairy Queen
Groom Flvinn Servb Keith Barklev Auto Reoar

State National Bank

s ’’

* '
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Obituaries
EDNA L. MCDONX LD JEWELL MAY DARNELL

Edna L. McDonald, of

a T 'S S ' died FricUy ^P*
Prayer services were 

Sunday at St. Thorn, s the 
Apostle Catholic Church 
Chapel with Monsignor 
Joseph Tash and Mon: ignor 
Francis Sinyer of St. Mary's 
Catholic Church as 
celebrants. Mass was at 10 
a m. Monday in St. Thomas 
the Apostle Catholic C turch 
with Monsignor Tash a Ticia- . 
ting. Burial was in Llano 
Cemetery by Schooler-’ 
Gordon Bell Avenue Ch apel.

Mrs. McDonald was bora 
in Louisville. Ky., and 
moved to Amarillo in 1955 
from Kansas City. Kan She 
was a housekeeper for many 
years at the St. Mary’s and 
St. Joseph’s rectories. Her 
husband, Francis A. 
McDonald died in 1979

Survivors include three 
daughters, Mrs. R ilph 
Britten of Amarillo formerly 
of Groom. Mrs. Chtries 
Knight of Houston and drs. 
Rose Ann McDonald, 
C.C.V.I. of Chicago, 111.; two 
sons, Joe McDonald of 
Amarillo; and George 
McDonald of Houston; two 
sisters. Mrs. Alma Poin t  of 
Amarillo and Mrs. Miltlred 
Koehler of Tucumcari,
N M.; 11 grandchildren; and 
21 great-grandchildren.

The family requests 
memorials to be to St. Aim’s 
Nursing Home.

Jewell May Darnell, 94 
passed away Thursday, 
September 27, 1990 in a 
nursing home.

Services were Saturday at 
Dutton Funeral Home with 
the Rev. Fines Rav 
Marchman (her nephew), 

pastor of Highland Baptist 
Church in Pampa, Texas, 
officiating. Graveside
services were in Boswell, 
Okla. Cemetery.

She was bora March 24, 
1896 in Blossom, Texas and 
had lived in Iowa Park since 
1976, moving from Poteau, 
Okla. She was a member of 
Southside Baptist Church of 
Poteau and a former 
member of Wesley Club of 
Waurika, Okla. She was a 
homemaker and wife of 
Malvin K. Darnell who 
preceded her in death in 
1964 They were long time 
residents of Boswell, Okla. 
area.

Survivors include four 
sons: Houston of Glade- 
water, Texas; Burl of 
Poteau, Okla.; Max of 
Blossom, Texas, and Johnny 
of Fort Worth, Texas; four 
daughters, Corene Davis 
and Sue McKnight, both of 
Iowa Park, and Myurl Lee 
and Eloise Willis both of 
Hollis, Okla.; a brother, Olin 
Tucker of Rosenberg, Texas, 
two sisters, Maggie Higgen- 
botthom of Boswell and 
Ruby Marchman of Groom, 
Texas; 66 grandchildren; 
and 30 great-grandchildren;

MUSEUM DAY 
BEEF

B a r ’ y e c u e  $ 5 .0 0  lb .
Rib Eye Steaks $5.00 lb. 

Hamburger $1.50 lb. 
Sacked.Hamburger & T-Bone 

$2.00 lb.
Front Quarter $1.00 lb.

(You pay pnx easing at Circle B in Groom)

Contact:
Ronalc Kotara, 537-3293 
Laquiia Hurt, 537-3524

and 15 great-great-grand­
children; and numerous 
nephews and nieces.

HOMER CALVIN ESTES

Homer Calvin Estes, 66, 
of Dardenelle, Ark. died 
Saturday, Sept. 22,1990 as a 
result of a sudden illness. 
Services were held Tuesday, 
Sept. 25, 1990.

Mr. Estes was a veteran of 
World War II, a member of 
the Church of Christ and the 
VFW. He was retired.

Survivors include his wife, 
Betty, one son and five 
daughters, one being Mrs. 
Toni Pavlovsky of Groom.

Card Of Thanks
We would like to thank 

those who have offered 
words of encouragement, 
brought food, came to visit 
and prayers in David’s 
recent accident.

A special thanks goes to 
the Groom Ambulance 
Service drivers; Tony 
Treadwell, David Britten 
and Jerry Crowell for their 
efficient service. David is 
doing fine and has returned 
to school this week.

Thanks again. 
Bud and Connie Fields 

and David
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4-H Bake Show
Four area 4-H members 

claimed top prizes at the 
Panhandle District 4-H 
Better Bake Show held 
Saturday at the Tri-State 
Fair and garnered cash 
prizes.

Winners include Stefan 
Hardin of Carson County, 
top senior product winner 
and Cassie Floyd of 
Hemphill County, best 
junior product baker.

First place records were 
compiled by senior 
contestant, Teresa LaMaster 
of Ochiltree County, and 
junior entrant, Claressa 
Scheer of Lipscomb County.

County bake show junior 
and senior product and 
record winners from the 
twenty county Top of Texas 
area were eligible to 
compete in the contest which 
is held to promote wheat 
consumerism, teach nutri­
tion and develop additional 
food  preparation  and skills.

J u n io r  (a g e s  *>-1 3 )  
prepared a quick bread

Five Generations

Wieberg. 
Welding 

Nathan Wieberg 

Shop-248-7270 

Home-248-7301

recipe of their choice and 
seniors (ages 14-19) prepar­
ed a yeast-leavened recipe.

Records were scored on 
the basis of goals set, 
k n o w le d g e  a t ta in e d ,  
ed u ca tiona l a c tiv itie s , 
leadership, citizenship and 
community service, awards 
and a summary of the bake 
show activities.

The contest is co­
sponsored annually by the 
Tri-State Fair and Texas 
Wheat Producers in 
Amarillo, Arrowhead Mills 
of Hereford and the Texas 
A g ricu ltu ra l E xtension 
Service.

Contestants from Carson 
County were: Stefan Hardin 
and Stacy Bertrand, Senior 
Participants and Natalie 
Cook and Regina Britten, 
J u n io r  P a r t i c ip a n t s .

Standing from right to 
left are; Essie Cooper 
Knowles, No. 2 daughter, 
LeWanda Redd, grand-

Not many women in 
Groom can boast five living 
generations. Essie Lee 
Cooper Knowles rejoices 
and thanks God’s Son for 
His continued loving care 
and Blessings throughout

daughter Nickey Evans, 
great granddaughter Jeanne 
Worthan Nation and great 
great grandson Haskel Lee 
Nation.
her 83 years.

All five generations are 
residents of Groom. The 
rocking chair belonged to 
the late B.H. Cooper. Photo 
by Kenneth Payton.

To Better Serve Your Health Care Needs...
Dr. Jack Albracht would /lire to announce his

new hours, Starting Monday, September 24

M O N D A Y  THROUGH FRIDA Y
8:3® - Moon, 2 p.m. - 5:15 p.m.

Thanks For A Great Welcome

ALBRACHT CHIROPRACTIC
2216 N. Coffee OF PAM PA 665-7161

d o n it a  h e r b e r
(emocntic Nominee 

Carson County
ix Assessor-Collector

Donita H erber 
Is  E xperienced 
and Q ualim > i

6 years as the 
current Deputy 
Tax Assessor- 
Collector 
4 years prior 
experience as a 
Business Office 
Manager 
2 years prior 
experience as a 
CPA Assistant

Y o u r  V o t e  W il l  B e 
A p p r e c ia t e d  N ov . 6

Pol.
Q.v .30 Panhandle, Tx 79068

d. by D>nrta Herber.

Our Medicare Supplement Insurance 
is among the best... 

good coverage, good price and 
good neighbor claim service

Ask About Health Insurance 
The State Farm Hay

GLEN COURTNEY t
2100 Perryton Parkway, Pampa, Texas

PHONE: 665-4051 or 1-800-658-6303
Like a good neighbor. State Farm is there.

State Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company 
Home Office: Bloomington. Illinois

N t* ttm ncttn l nr endorsed 
(sa m im m i oe Federal Medicare C

explanation a# benefits and lim itations
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COUNTY EMERt !ENCY 
STAGED IN M )CK 
EXERCISE SEIT.26

A Natural Disaster 
Exercise was conducted at 
9:00 a.m. Wednesd »y, Sept. 
26. at the Emergem y Opera­
tion Center in the Carson

County Courthouse.
During the exercise, the 

EDC was activated and a 
s im u la te d  to rn a d o  
emergency focuses on the 
town of Groom. Upon activa­
tion of the EDC, various 
agencies were called upon to 
make the exercise realistic, 
with emphasis on persons 
w ith  d e c is io n -m a k in g  
authority.

Judge Roselius, E M. 
Director and County Judge, 
said "This was an excellent
opportunity for each partici­
pant to gain knowledge 
about the actual decision' 
making process when a 
natural disaster strikes. It is 
important that all County/ 
Local officials understand 
the importance of being 
prepared for an emergency

before it occurs.”
The evaluation that came 

out of the tornado exercise 
included: chain of command 
and alternatives, informa­
tion resources, toxic hazards 
from accidents, and the 
utilization of Pantex 
resources.

Participating in the 
exercise were Tracy Kotara. 
County C om m issioner,

SHOP OUR 
EVERYDAY 

LOW PRICES.
m  APPRECIATE YOU!

AlISUPS

ALLSUP'S

CORN DOGS
ADC 0  REGULAR COFFEE

FOLGERS
13 0Z. BRICK BAG

$  \  W

FOR
FRESH DELCIOUS

SAUSAGE &  
BISCUIT

2 $1
FOR

SHURSAVING Flour 51b. bag 9 9 '
FILLED WITH YOUR 

FAVORITE IttUNTAIN DRINK

TAI.LSUP
BIG : 2 0Z. SIZE

4 9 *

ALL COKE FAMILY

COKES
6 PACK; 12 0Z. CANS

S
j s s s s l  h o t  m o o s  m e n u  1 A U  ALLSUP'S LOCATIONSN  HRS A OAY

AVAILABLE AT

99* 
♦3.99 
♦3.99 

79° 
99* 

♦1.19 
79c 

♦1.59 
♦1.49 
♦1.99

CALL IN  ORDERS WELCOME

BARBECUE BEEF
SANOWICH
BARBECUE
PORK RIBS (IBJ
BARBECUE WHO i
CHICKEN
AU. SUP'S
BURRITO
BREAKFAST
BURRITO
BURRITO
BEEF f» SALSA
DELICIOUS
CHEESEBURGER
CHICKEN
FRIED STEAK
3 COUNT
CHICKEN STRIPS
WIP0TAT0 WEDOESI
CHICKEN (2 PCS) USCUIT

S PIECE BOX 
CHICKEN 
BEEF (r CHEESE 
CHIMICHANGA 
(MEAD)
CORN DOG 
DELICIOUS 
HAMBURGER 
WILSON 
HOT LINKS 
SAUSAGE 
ON A STICK 
SAUSAGE b 
BISCUIT 
SAUSAGE. EGG 
it BISCUIT 
SAUTEEYA 
SAUSAGE 
4 COUNT 
STEAK FINGERS

♦4.99
♦1.19

3 for$1
59c
99*

♦1.49
2 FOR *1
♦1.09
♦1.09
♦ 1.00

CHECK OUR WEEKLY 
SPECIALS

$

ShurSaving 14oz.can

Dog Food 4 / * l 00
Nice & Soft

Bathroom Tissue
4 RollPkg. T 9

GROOM

Prices Effective October 7-13 

While Supplies Last

Prect. 4; Jerry Strawn, Roselius; and Wanda Hood,
Prect. 3: Mike Britten, coordinator of Carson
Prect. 1; Chock Smith, C o u n ty  E m erg en cy
Prect. 2; Sheriff Terry Management.
Timmons;tony Ladino, DOE 
Chief of Environmental,
Safety and Health; Judge

Raising Parents Conference
Parents in this area have 

an opoportunity to improve 
their parenting skills by 
attending a special 
c o n fe re n c e ,  “ R a is in g  
P a r e n t s , ”  S a tu rd a y , 
November 17th at First 
Christian Church, 3001 
Wolflin Avenue, 
Amarillo, from 9:00 to 4:30 
p.m.

This conference includes 
general sessions featuring 
authorities on all aspects of 
parenting skills, as well as 
n u m e ro u s  b re a k -o u t  
sessions where parents can 
find out more about a 
specific area of interest to 
them.

"R aising Parents”  is 
designed to help all types 
of parents; single parent, 
parent at home, dual career 
parent, or step parent.

Featured speakers include 
Dr. Diane Welch and Dr. 
Dorthy Taylor, Family Life 
Education Specialists for 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service with Dr. Lynne 
Thibodeaux. 4-H and Youth 
Development Specialist with 
T.A.E.S.

I n d iv id u a l  s e s s io n s  
include such relevant topics

as Peer Pressure, Develop­
ing Self Esteem, Sex Educa­
tion. Literacy, Discipline, 
Parenting for African Ameri­
can Families, Date Rape, 
Cults, Adolescent Suicide 
and Child Day Care.

Child care for "Raising 
Parents will be available to 
the first 45 who register and 
request child care. There is a 
$10.00 fee for the conference 
which includes lunch. In 
addition. DEU’s and PDU’s 
will be available.

"Raising Parents” is a 
cooperative effort between 
the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service; Making 
the Grade:Collaboration for 
Youth, Family, Community; 
Teen-Age Pregnancy and 
Parenting Program; P.T.A. 
Amarillo and Canyon 
Councils; Catholic Family 
Services; Region 16 Educa­
tion Service Center; Texas 
Plains Girl Scout Council; 
and Texans’ War on Drugs.

Educational programs 
conducted by the Texas 
A gricu ltural Extension 
Service serve people of all 
ages regardless of socio­
economic levels, race, color, 
sex, religion or national 
origin.

Bill & Sam's Garage
To Serve Your Automotive NeedsI 

24 Hour Towing

404 E. Front Groom 248-7335

John Wagner 248-7940, nights

C & H Supply, Inc.
McLean, Texas 779-2209

Check out Our Price Reduced 
Summer Products And Just 

Received Fall & Winter Supplies

M cLean  

Video Quest
114 N. Main Street 779-2311

Tape and VCR Rental

2/$3°° $5°°

Open Mon,-Sat. 12 -8:00 p.m.

* * es
/  ~n*
V  Sound that 

>  Sdb~ Otf-

A uction - Co.

McLean. Tx 79057 Box 42 (806) 779-} 154
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NOTES & TALES
from

OLD ROUTE 66
by D. Trow

With almost every type 
character known traveling 
clown Old 66 in it’s heyday, 
McLean never had a really 
tasty incident involving its 
law enforcement officers. Its 
seldom they will tell about 
their experiences, except 
Maybe an amusing one.

My mother tells of her and 
Had and the Carl Laflins 
leaving McLean going to a 
musical session near 
Shamrock. A few miles out, 
I*ad suddently swerved, hit 
his brakes and started back­
ing up. There was a man 
h'ing on the edge of the 
highway. They stopped and 
gathered around the man, 
» ho they thought had been 
hit. Troy and Jerry Corbin 
drove up to see about it and 
tltev took baby blankets from

heir car to cover the man. 
Troy rushed to a phone to 

■ nil the ambulance. They 
. md the law opfficers arrived 
.md rushed the man to the 
liospital. The doctor examin­
'd  him, finding nothing 
vrong with him, and no 
dentification-just nothing. 
~hey placed him a room for 

observation. They discover­
'd  him later up and around 
and obviously OK. They 
> ailed J.D. Fish and he 
1 letermined the man was 
hitchhiking and just didn't 
want to spend the night in 
1 he cold. J.D. loaded him 
ip, carried him to the county 

line and sent him on, trying 
to forget the time and 
' expense that was wasted.

Red Easton tells about a 
carload of men from 
1 California, all but the driver 
were drunk, stopped on Old 
'16 to relieve themselves. 
• [.D. happened along and 
! topped to check them out. 
'hey started cussing him, 

“ exas and everything

around. J.D. didn’t have his 
gun and things could have 
gotten out of hand, but Red 
drove up in his pick-up, 
rolled his window down, 
stuck out his .357 and told 
them to load and go. It 

, probably was the fastest 
sober-up and departure in 
history. I imagine if I had 
been standing in the ditch, 
and a Texas pick-up came 
up, a cannon leveled at my 
head, backed up by an 
unsmiling face as ugly as 
Reds, topped off by a black 
hat that just barely fit in the 
pick-up, I would have left 
too.

We can’t thank J.D., but 
we can thank Red and other 
law officers down through 
the years, for their patience 
and common sense when 
confronted with circum­
stances that could have been 
bad. Thanks fellows, we 
appreciate you.

1

Locals Discuss 

World
Every day for the past 20 

years, 92-year-old, L.L. 
Rogers and “ the boys” have 
had morning coffee at the 
Rexall drugstore where they 
josh with the waitress and 
solve the world’s problems.

As far as Rogers, the elder 
statesman of the group, is 
concerned, the nation’s 
plunge into immorality 
occurred when a singer 
named Elvis Presley started 
wiggling his hips. His more 
liberal cronies in this Texas 
Panhandle community of 
1,160 beg to differ.

They believe the nation’s 
moral decline began with the 
British Invasion-not the 
Revolutionary War, but the 
Beatles.

Sam Haynes, the mayor of 
what is known as “The 
Friendly Town” along old 
Route 66, wonders at day­
time soap operas that 
“ open every single time 
with two people in bed.” His 
brother, rancher John

M cLean A g Teaci ter A ttends Ag/W ildlife Training *  afJ £  b££
d o w n  o f  th e  American 
fam ily , and w arns: “ B efore  
you know  it , w e ’ll b e  like 
France.”

And John Holland, the 
town cop, worries about 
people’s general ‘‘un­
caring, ” an attitude he says 
extends from one’s self 
esteem to the personal and 
property rights of others.

Carl Dwyer, the former 
school superintendent, is 
optimistic.

“ I’m seeing changes in 
our kids in school,” said the 
63 -year-o ld . “ T hey’re 
dressing neater. They have 
more pride in themselves. 
There’s still that sense of ‘I 
want mine and I want it 
now,’ but I think maybe 
that’s changing.”

“ But of course,” he says, 
“ nothing changes fast 
enough for an old man.”

Traveling to Hill Country 
tor an education field trip 
was Bill Layman of McLean. 
Bill is the Ag Teacher. He 
took training in diversified 
agriculture/wildlife and 
recreational management.

Focus of the training was 
producing and marketing of 
fish, wildlife and fruits, 
fabricating metal and 
managing natural resources. 
Agriculture teachers saw 
first-hand the animals and 
produce about which they 
teach and were able to ask 
questions of experts who 
have been successful in

- nanagement of enterprises.
Twenty-six agriculture 

cience teachers from Texas 
attended the field trip which 
'vas sponsored by the 
)epartment of Agriculture 

at Southwest Texas State 
University. Highlights of the 
trip were visits to 
Vgriculture Enterprises (cat- 
ish and striper production), 
Vlamo Group (Rhino and 

Terrain King implement 
fabrication), Hallford
Orchard, Natural Bridge 
Vildlife Ranch (ostrich and 

exotic animals), Welge 
tanch (deer management), 
»aks Cedar Corporation

(processing cedar trees into 
oil), Y-O Ranch (exotic 
animal management), Texas 
Wild Game Cooperative 
(exotic meat processing), 
and Dale Priour Wool Ware­
house (exotic animal 
management).

The Texas Education 
Agency-approved workshop 
supplemnted the essential 
elements of the agricultural 
science and technology 
program. Southwest Texas 
State University professor. 
Dr. John Dillingham, 
coordinates AAT for 
teachers during summer 
inservice workshops.

Farmers Receive Less O f Food Dollars

On average. American 
farmers and ranchers 
receive less than a quarter of 
every dollar U.S. consumers 
spend on food, according to 
the Texas Farm Bureau.

Statistics for 1989 show 
the farm value of food 
consumed at and away from 
home dropped to 24 cents, a 
one-penny decline from 
1988. the TFB said.

The largest slice of the 
food-dollar pie, 35 cents, 
went to labor. Labor costs 
increased a half cent from 
1988. Packaging also 
increased a half-cent to 8.5 
cents, while rent and depre­
ciation claimed 7 cents. 
Intercity transportatidfi was 
4.5 cents and advertising 
took 4.5 cents.

The remaining 17.5 cents 
paid for miscellaneous items 
such as taxes, insurance, 
repairs, interest, electricity

wd other smaller costs.
As for individual food 

terns, the price spread 
depended on the crop and 
(he amount of further 
Drocessing required.

Last year, the farm value 
jf a one-pound loaf of bread 
vas 4.8 cents, while the 
iverage retail price as 61.3 
;ents. A dozen eggs brought 
a farmer 64.6 cents, but cost 
SI at the store, while a half­
gallon of milk had a farm 
value of 58.9 cents and a 
retail price of $1.27.

From the meat case, 
producers received $1.55 a 
pound for choice beef while 
consumers paid $2.70. Pork 
returned 70.4 cents a pound 
to the farm, but fetched 
SI.83 at the store, while 
broilers earned farmers 
51.4 cents a pound and cost 
shoppers 92.7 cents.

Retail, food price 
differences between 1950

and 1989 also depended on 
the crop and the amount of 
further processing required, 
plus inflation. The increased 
efficiency of farmers kept 
prices from rising more than 
they did the Consumer Price 
Index increased 446 percent 
between 1950 and 1989.

In 1950, a pound of broiler 
cost 59.5 cents at the store, 
and only increased to 92.7 
cents by 1989.

Eggs were 60.4 cents a 
dozen in 1950 and a dollar 
last year.

Potatoes increased from
4.6 cents a pound to 30.6 
cents.

A half gallon of milk cost
38.6 cents in 1950 and was 
priced at $1.27 in 1989.
A pound of bread was 14.3 
cents in 1950 and was 66 
cents last year.

Tomatoes per pound 
jumped from 24.3 cents to 91 
cents.

3rd Ranked State 
Tigers Win Again 

By Beating Harrold
McLean Tigers were 

victorious Friday night when 
they played Hairold scoring 
46 to their 6.

McLean totaled an out­
standing 352 yards while 
Harrold’s 130 yard paled by 
comparison.

C h r is t ia n  Looney 
completed 9 of 13 passes for

Homecoming 

' Schedule

Thursday night, Oct. 11- 
Jr. High game at Lefors,
6:00 p.m.

Black Light Pep Rally in 
the High School Auditorium 
at 8:00 p.m. or shortly there­
after depending upon the 
arrival of the coaches and Jr. 
High team from Lefors.

■ Pep Rally followed by Bon 
Fire

Come out and help us get
ready for D i s t r i c t  play. W e  
w ill play Lefors on O ct. 12 a t
7:30 p.m.

Queen Coronation-7:00 
J.V. Game at 4:30 p.m.

WEATHER REPORT
DATE HIGH LOW

9-24-90 73 46
9-25-90 92 56
9-26-90 94 56
9-26-90 94 66
9-27-90 78 62
9-28-90 81 60
9-29-90 75 59
9-30-90 69 57

Methodist

Conference
The annual meeting of the 

McLean United Methodist 
Church membership will be 
held on Wednesday evening 
October 10th. Beginning 
with a covered dish dinner at 
6:30, the evening will 
continue with devotional 
time and a business meet­
ing. District Superintendent 
Rev. Jo Carr will preside at 
the meeting as we come 
together to see where our 
community of faith has come 
during the past year and 
what we seek to achieve for 
God in the Body of Christ 
during the coming year. 
Hope to see as many church 
members as possible!

124 yards. Kusmng for 4 
TD’s was Dennis Hill.

Tuffy Sanders scored on 
an 11 yard run and had 3 
conversion kicks. Daniel 
Harris brought one home 
from one yard out in other 
scoring.

Next week McLean will 
face off with Valley at 7:30 
p.m.

Girls
Football To Be 

Held Monday

Monday, October 8th at
6:30 p.m. the McLean High 
School Student Council is 
sponsoring a High School 
Girls Flag Football game.
During halftime there will be
a perform ance by e le m e n ­
tary s tu d e n ts  and C orona­
tion o f  a se n io r  citizen  king  
and q u een . K ing can d id ates  
are L.L. R ogers, J e s s e  O. 
Coleman and J.W . 
Meacham. Queen candi­
dates are Margaret 
Coleman, Fern Boyd and 
Ruth Magee. The king and 
queen will be determined by 
money donations placed in 
jars at various businesses. 
All proceeds will go to the 
MHS Stiudent Council.

I Precipitation for the week
11.70

McLean Briefs

Shaley Stalls of McLean is 
in Coronado Community 
Hospital in Pampa. She was 
working out at gymnastics 
on Sunday evening and 
broke a bone in her arm. At 
press time, she was still in 
the hospital recovering after 
surgery.

J. Boyd Smith and Ken 
Blanchard attended the 
cook out at “ Chevron” out of 
Pampa on the Borger High­
way, Saturday, Sept. 29th.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Haynes 
and Dan Fish visited Dollie 
Haynes at Oklahoma Univer­
sity last Saturday and 
attended the OU-Kansas 
fo o tb a ll  g am e . ’

REMNDER!
McLEAN COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR

Broom SaletThe Lion’s 
Club will be holding their 
annual broom sale begin­
ning Oct. 5 at 8:00 a.m. at 
Lion’s Club building. This 
will run through Oct. 16th. 
On Oct. 15th at 5:00 p.m. 
they will go from door to 
door. This is made possible 
by the "Light House for the 
Blind and Our Lion’s Club. .

The Alanreed School
Parent Teacher Organization 
has set Saturday, October 
27, for the Alanreed PTO 
Com m unity Hallow een 
Carnival at 6:30 p.m.

Notice-Public Hearing on
the 1990-91 Budget for he 
City of McLean will be held 
October 11, 1990 at 7:00 
p.m.
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NOTES & TALES
from

OLD ROUTE 66
by D.Trew

With almost every type 
character known traveling 
down Old 66 in it’s heyday, 
McLean never had a really 
nasty incident involving its 
law enforcement officers. Its 
seldom they will tell about 
their experiences, except 
maybe an amusing one.

My mother tells of her and 
Dal and the Carl Laflins 
tearing McLean going to a 
musical session near 
Shamrock. A few miles out. 
Dad suddently swerved, hit 
his brakes and started back­
ing up. There was a man 
lying on the edge of the 
highway. They stopped and 
gathered around the man, 
who they thought had been 
hit Troy and Jerry Corbin 
drove up to see about it and 
they took baby blankets from

their car to cover the man. 
T roy rushed to a phone to 
call the ambulance. They 
* nd the law opfficers arrived 
i nd rushed the man to the 
1 ospital. The doctor examin- 
c d him, finding nothing 
wrong with him, and no 
i ientification-just nothing. 
They placed him a room for 
tbservation. They discover­
ed him later up and around 
tnd obviously OK. They 
( ailed J.D. Fish and he 
«etermined the man was 
> itchhiking and just didn’t 
want to spend the night in 
the cold. J.D. loaded him 
i p. carried him to the county 
line and sent him on, trying 
t a forget the time and 
i xpense that was wasted.

Red Easton tells about a 
( arload of men from 
t 'alifornia, all but the driver 
were drunk, stopped on Old 
16 to relieve themselves. 
. .D. happened along and 
! topped to check them out. 
"hey started cussing him, 
Texas and everything

around. J.D. didn’t have his 
gun and things could have 
gotten out of hand, but Red 
drove up in his pick-up, 
rolled his window down, 
stuck out his .357 and told 
them to load and go. It 

.  probably was the fastest 
sober-up and departure in 
history. I imagine if I had 
been standing in the ditch, 
and a Texas pick-up came 
up. a cannon leveled at my 
head, backed up by an 
unsmiling face as ugly as 
Reds, topped off by a black 
hat that just barely fit in the 
pick-up, I would have left 
too.

We can’t thank J.D., but 
we can thank Red and other 
law officers down through 
the years, for their patience 
and common sense when 
confronted with circum­
stances that could have been 
bad. Thanks fellows, we 
appreciate you.

Locals Discuss 

World
Every day for the past 20 

years, 92-year-old, L.L. 
Rogers and “ the boys” have 
had morning coffee at the 
Rexall drugstore where they 
josh with the waitress and 
solve the world’s problems.

As far as Rogers, the elder 
statesman of the group, is 
concerned, the nation’s 
plunge into immorality 
occurred when a singer 
named Elvis Presley started 
wiggling his hips. His more 
liberal cronies in this Texas 
Panhandle community of 
1,160 beg to differ.

They believe the nation's 
moral decline began with the 
British Invasion--not the 
Revolutionary War, but the 
Beatles.

Sam Haynes, the mayor of 
what is known as “The 
Friendly Town” along old 
Route 66, wonders at day­
time soap operas that 
"open every single time 
with two people in bed.” His 
brother, rancher John

M cLean A g Teaci\er AttendsAg/W ildlife Training £ £ £
down of the American 
fam ily , and w arns: " B efore  
you know it, we'll be like 
France.”

And John Holland, the 
town cop, worries about 
people’s general “ un­
caring,” an attitude he says 
extends from one's self 
esteem to the personal and 
property rights of others.

Carl Dwyer, the former 
school superintendent, is 
optimistic.

“ I’m seeing changes in 
our kids in school,” said the 
63 -year-o ld . “ T hey’re 
dressing neater. They have 
more pride in themselves. 
There’s still that sense of ‘I 
want mine and I want it 
now,' but 1 think maybe 
that's changing.”

“ But of course,” he says, 
"nothing changes fast 
enough for an old man.”

Traveling to Hill Country 
for an education field trip 
was Bill Layman of McLean. 
Bill is the Ag Teacher. He 
took training in diversified 
agriculture/wildlife and 
recreational management.

Focus of the training was 
producing and marketing of 
fish, wildlife and fruits, 
fabricating metal and 
managing natural resources. 
Agriculture teachers saw 
first-hand the animals and 
produce about which they 
teach and were able to ask 
questions of experts who 
have been successful in

i nanagement of enterprises.
Twenty-six agriculture 

frience teachers from Texas 
i ttended the field trip which 
was sponsored by the 
Department of Agriculture 
1 1 Southwest Texas State 
I Iniversity. Highlights of the 
trip were visits to 
agriculture Enterprises (cat- 
1 ish and striper production), 
Alamo Group (Rhino and 
“ errata King implement 
1 abrication), Hallford
Orchard, Natural Bridge 
'Vildlife Ranch (ostrich and 
exotic animals), Welge 
Ranch (deer management), 
I’aks Cedar Corporation

(processing cedar trees into 
oil), Y-0 Ranch (exotic 
animal management), Texas 
Wild Game Cooperative 
(exotic meat processing), 
and Dale Priour Wool Ware­
house (exotic animal 
management).

The Texas Education 
Agency-approved workshop 
supplemnted the essential 
elements of the agricultural 
science and technology 
program. Southwest Texas 
State University professor, 
Dr. John Dillingham, 
coordinates AAT for 
teachers during summer 
inservice workshops.

*  Farmers Receive Less O f Food Dollars
and 1989 also depended on 
the crop and the amount of 
further processing required, 
plus inflation. The increased 
efficiency of farmers kept 
prices from rising more than 
they did the Consumer Price 
Index increased 446 percent 
between 1950 and 1989.

In 1950, a pound of broiler 
cost 59.5 cents at the store, 
and only increased to 92.7 
cents by 1989.

Eggs were 60.4 cents a 
dozen in 1950 and a dollar 
last year.

Potatoes increased from
4.6 cents a pound to 30.6 
cents.

A half gallon of milk cost
38.6 cents in 1950 and was 
priced at $1.27 in 1989.
A pound of bread was 14.3 
cents in 1950 and was 66 
cents last year.

Tomatoes per pound 
jumped from 24.3 cents to 91 
cents.

On average, American 
farmers and ranchers 
receive less than a quarter of 
every dollar U.S. consumers 
spend on food, according to 
the Texas Farm Bureau.

Statistics for 1989 show 
the farm value of food 
consumed at and away from 
home dropped to 24 cents, a 
one-penny decline from 
1988. the TFB said

The largest slice of the 
fojd-dollar pie, 35 cents, 
went to labor. Labor costs 
increased a half cent from 
1988. Packaging also 
increased a half cent to 8.5 
cents, while rent and depre­
ciation claimed 7 cents. 
Intercity transportation was 
4-5 cents and advertising 
took 4.5 cents.

The remaining 17.5 cents 
psid for miscellaneous items 
such as taxes, insurance, 
frpairs, interest, electricity’

tod other smaller costs
As for individual food 

terns, the price spread • 
lepended on the crop and 

the amount of further 
irocessing required.

Last year, the farm value 
. if a one-pound loaf of bread 
■vas 4.8 cents, while the 
tverage retail price as 61.3 
■ents. A dozen eggs brought 

a farmer 64.6 cents, but cost 
51 at the store, while a half- 
>allon of milk had a farm 
alue of 58.9 cents and a 
etail price of $1.27.

From the meat case, 
ireducers received $1.55 a 
>ound for choice beef while 
onsumers paid $2.70. Pork 
eturned 70.4 cents a pound 
o the farm, but fetched 

51.83 at the store, while 
broilers earned farmers 

51.4 cents a pound and cost 
shoppers 92.7 cents.

Retail. food price 
iifferences between 1950

3rd Ranked State 
Tigers Win Again 

By Beating Harrold
McLean Tigers were 

victorious Friday night when 
they played Han-old scoring 
46 to their 6.

McLean totaled an out­
standing 352 yards while 
Harrold’s 130 yard paled by 
comparison.

C h r is t ia n  Looney 
completed 9 of 13 passes for

Homecoming 

- Schedule

Thursday night, Oct. 11- 
Jr. High game at Lefors, 
6:00 p.m.

Black Light Pep Rally in 
the High School Auditorium 
at 8:00 p.m. or shortly there­
after depending upon the 
arrival of the coaches and Jr. 
High team from Lefors.
• Pep Rally followed by Bon 
Fire

Come out and help us get
ready for D istrict play. W e  
w ill p lay Lefors on Oct. 12 a t  
7:30 p .m .

Q ueen  C oronation-7:00
J.V. Game at 4:30 p.m.

WEATHER REPORT
DATE HIGH LOW

9-24-90 73 46
9-25-90 92 56
9-26-90 94 56
9-26-90 94 66
9-27-90 78 62
9-28-90 81 60
9-29-90 75 59
9-30-90 69 57

Methodist

Conference
The annual meeting of the 

McLean United Methodist 
Church membership will be 
held on Wednesday evening 
October 10th. Beginning 
with a covered dish dinner at 
6:30, the evening will 
continue with devotional 
time and a business meet­
ing. District Superintendent 
Rev. Jo Carr will preside at 
the meeting as we come 
together to see where our 
community of faith has come 
during the past year and 
what we seek to achieve for 
God in the Body of Christ 
during the coming year. 
Hope to see as many church 
members as possible!

124 yards. Kusntng for 4 
TD’s was Dennis Hill.

Tuffy Sanders scored on 
an 11 yard run and had 3 
conversion kicks. Daniel 
Harris brought one home 
from one yard out in other 
scoring.

Next week McLean will 
face off with Valley at 7:30 
p.m.

Girls

Football To Be 

Held Monday

Monday, October 8th at
6:30 p.m. the McLean High 
School Student Council is 
sponsoring a High School 
Girls Flag Football game. 
During halftime there will be
a performance by elemen­
tary students and Corona­
tion of a senior citizen king 
and queen. King candidates 
are L.L. Rogers, Jesse O. 
Coleman and J.W . 
Meacham. Queen candi­
dates are Margaret 
Coleman, Fern Boyd and 
Ruth Magee. The king and 
queen will be determined by 
money donations placed in 
jars at various businesses. 
All proceeds will go to the 
MHS Stiudent Council.

I Precipitation for the week
11.70

McLean Briefs

Shaley Stalls of McLean is 
in Coronado Community 
Hospital in Pampa. She was 
working out at gymnastics 
on Sunday evening and 
broke a bone in her arm. At 
press time, she was still in 
the hospital recovering after 
surgery.

J. Boyd Smith and Ken 
Blanchard attended the 
cook out at “ Chevron” out of 
Pampa on the Borger High­
way, Saturday, Sept. 29th.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Haynes 
and Dan Fish visited Dollie 
Haynes at Oklahoma Univer­
sity last Saturday and 
attended the OU-Kansas 
fo o tb a ll  g am e . '

REMINDER!
McLEAN COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR

_____ SaieiThe Lion’s
Club will be holding their 
annual broom sale begin­
ning Oct. 5 at 8:00 a.m. at 
Lion's Club building. This 
will run through Oct. 16th. 
On Oct. 15th at 5:00 p.m. 
they will go from door to 
door. This is made possible 
by the "Light House for the 
Blind and Our Lion’s Club. .

The Alanreed School
Parent Teacher Organization 
has set Saturday, October 
27, for the Alanreed PTO 
Com m unity Hallow een 
Carnival at 6:30 p.m.

Notice-Public Hearing on
the 1990-91 Budget for he 
City of McLean will be held 
October 11, 1990 at 7:00 
p.m.
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NOTES & TALES
from

OLD ROUTE 66
by D. Trow

With almost every type 
character known traveling 
down Old 66 in it’s heyday, 
McLean never had a really 
nasty incident involving its 
law enforcement officers. Its 
seldom they will tell about 
their experiences, except 
maybe an amusing one.

My mother tells of her and 
Dad and the Carl Laflins 
leaving McLean going to a 
musical session near 
Shamrock. A few miles out. 
Dad suddently swerved, hit 
his brakes and started back­
ing up. There was a man 
lying on the edge of the 
highway. They stopped and 
gathered around the man, 
who they thought had been 
hit. Troy and Jerry Corbin 
drove up to see about it and 
thev took baby blankets from

Commerce Bank Building No. 5 Thursday, October 4,1990 779*2141

their car to cover the man. 
T roy rushed to a phone to 
call the ambulance. They 
* nd the law opfficers arrived 
*nd rushed the man to the 
1 ospital. The doctor examin- 
cd him, finding nothing 
wrong with him, and no 
i lentificaiion-just nothing. 
They placed him a room for 
cbservation. They discover­
ed him later up and around 
»nd obviously OK. They 
called J.D. Fish and he 
c etermined the man was 
1 itchhiking and just didn’t 
want to spend the night in 
the cold. J.D. loaded him 
i ip, carried him to the county 
1 Ine and sent him on, trying 
t > forget the time and
< xpense that was wasted.

Red Easton tells about a 
( arload of men from
< California, all but the driver 
were drunk, stopped on Old 
lb  to relieve themselves. 
. .D. happened along and 
! topped to check them out. 
'h ey  started cussing him, 
Texas and everything

around. J.D. didn’t have his 
gun and things could have 
gotten out of hand, but Red 
drove up in his pick-up, 
rolled his window down, 
stuck out his .357 and told 
them to load and go. It 

, probably was the fastest 
sober-up and departure in 
history. I imagine if I had 
been standing in the ditch, 
and a Texas pick-up came 
up, a cannon leveled at my 
head, backed up by an 
unsmiling face as ugly as 
Reds, topped off by a black 
hat that just barely fit in the 
pick-up, I would have left 
too.

We can’t thank J.D., but 
we can thank Red and other 
law officers down through 
the years, for their patience 
and common sense when 
confronted with circum­
stances that could have been 
bad. Thanks fellows, we 
appreciate you.

Locals Discuss 

World
Every day for the past 20 

years, 92-year-old, L.L. 
Rogers and “ the boys” have 
had morning coffee at the 
’Rexall drugstore where they 
josh with the waitress and 
solve the world’s problems.

As far as Rogers, the elder 
statesman of the group, is 
concerned, the nation’s 
plunge into immorality 
occurred when a singer 
named Elvis Presley started 
wiggling his hips. His more 
liberal cronies in this Texas 
Panhandle community of 
1,160 beg to differ.

They believe the nation's 
moral decline began with the 
British Invasion--not the 
Revolutionary War, but the
Beatles.

Sam Haynes, the mayor of 
what is known as “The 
Friendly Town" along old 
Route 66, wonders at day­
time soap operas that 
"open every single time 
with two people in bed.” His 
brother, rancher John

M cLean A g Teac! \er A ttends Ag/W ildlife Training *ee
d o w n  o f  the American 
fam ily , and warns: “ B efore  
you know it, we’ll be like 
France.”

And John Holland, the 
town cop, worries about 
people’s general “ un­
caring,” an attitude he says 
extends from one’s self 
esteem to the personal and 
property rights of others.

Carl Dwyer, the former 
school superintendent, is 
optimistic.

" I’m seeing changes in 
our kids in school,” said the 
63-year-o ld . “ T hey’re 
dressing neater. They have 
more pride in themselves. 
There’s still that sense of ‘1 
want mine and I want it 
now,’ but I think maybe 
that’s changing.”

"But of course,” he says, 
“ nothing changes fast 
enough for an old man.”

Traveling to Hill Country 
for an education field trip 
was Bill Layman of McLean. 
Bill is the Ag Teacher. He 
took training in diversified 
agriculture/wildlife and 
recreational management.

Focus of the training was 
producing and marketing of 
fish, wildlife and fruits, 
fabricating metal and 
managing natural resources. 
Agriculture teachers saw 
first-hand the animals and 
produce about which they 
teach and were able to ask 
questions of experts who 
have been successful in

management of enterprises.
Twenty-six agriculture 

i cience teachers from Texas 
i ttended the field trip which 
was sponsored by the 
Department of Agriculture 
1 1 Southwest Texas State 
University. Highlights of the 
trip were visits to 
Agriculture Enterprises (cat­
tish and striper production), 
Alamo Group (Rhino and 
“ errain King implement 
I abrication), Hallford
Orchard, Natural Bridge 
’Vildlife Ranch (ostrich and 
exotic animals), Welge 
Ranch (deer management), 
l ’aks Cedar Corporation

(processing cedar trees into 
oil), Y-0 Ranch (exotic 
animal management), Texas 
Wild Game Cooperative 
(exotic meat processing), 
and Dale Priour Wool Ware­
house (exotic animal 
management).

The Texas Education 
Agency-approved workshop 
supplemnted the essential 
elements of the agricultural 
science and technology 
program. Southwest Texas 
State University professor. 
Dr. John Dillingham, 
coordinates AAT for 
teachers during summer 
inservice workshops.

Farmers Receive Less O f Food Dollars

On average, American 
farmers and ranchers 
receive less than a quarter of 
every dollar U.S. consumers 
spend on food, according to 
the Texas Farm Bureau.

Statistics for 1989 show 
the farm value of food 
consumed at and away from 
home dropped to 24 cents, a 
one-penny decline from 
1988. the TFB said.

The largest slice of the 
food-dotlar pie, 35 cents, 
went to labor. Labor costs 
increased a half cent from 
1988. Packaging also 
increased a half-cent to 8.5 
cents, while rent and depre­
ciation claimed 7 cents. 
Intercity transportstidfi was 
4.5 cents and advertising 
took 4.5 cents.

The remaining 17.5 cents 
paid for miscellaneous items 
such as taxes, insurance, 
repairs, interest, electricity

iod other smaller costs.
As for individual food 

terns, the price spread - 
lepended on the crop and 
he amount of further 

processing required.
Last year, the farm value 

if a one-pound loaf of bread 
vas 4.8 cents, while the 
iverage retoil price as 61.3 
■ents. A dozen eggs brought 

a farmer 64.6 cents, but cost 
SI at the store, while a half- 
>allon of milk had a farm 
•alue of 58.9 cents and a 
etail price of $1.27.

From the meat case, 
iroducers received $1.55 a 
>ound for choice beef while 
onsumers paid $2.70. Pork 
e  turned 70.4 cents a pound 
o the farm, but fetched 

SI.83 at the store, while 
broilers earned farmers 

51.4 cents a pound and cost 
hoppers 92.7 cents.

Retail. food price 
iifferences between 1950

and 1989 also depended on 
the crop and the amount of 
further processing required, 
plus inflation. The increased 
efficiency of farmers kept 
prices from rising more than 
they did the Consumer Price 
Index increased 446 percent 
between 1950 and 1989.

In 1950. a pound of broiler 
cost 59.5 cents at the store, 
and only increased to 92.7 
cents by 1989.

Eggs were 60.4 cents a 
dozen in 1950 and a dollar 
last year.

Potatoes increased from
4.6 cents a pound to 30.6 
cents.

A half gallon of milk cost
38.6 cents in 1950 and was 
priced at $1.27 in 1989.
A pound of bread was 14.3 
cents in 1950 and was 66 
cents last year.

Tomatoes per pound 
jumped from 24.3 cents to 91 
cents.

3rd Ranked State 
Tigers Win Again 

By Beating Harr old
McLean Tigers were 

victorious Friday night when 
they played Harrold scoring 
46 to their 6.

McLean totaled an out­
standing 352 yards while 
Harrold's 130 yard paled by 
comparison.

C h r is t ia n  Looney 
completed 9 of 13 passes for

Homecoming 

- Schedule

Thursday night, Oct. 11- 
Jr. High game at Lefors, 
6:00 p.m.

Black Light Pep Rally in 
the High School Auditorium 
at 8:00 p.m. or shortly there­
after depending upon the 
arrival of the coaches and Jr. 
High team from Lefors.

• Pep Rally followed by Bon 
Fire

Come out and help us get
ready for D istrict p lay. W e  
w ill play Lefors on  Oct. 12 at 
7:30 p.m.

Q ueen  C oronation-7:00
J.V. Game at 4:30 p.m.

WEATHER REPORT
DATE HIGH LOW

9-24-90 73 46
9-25-90 92 56
9-26-90 94 56
9-26-90 94 66
9-27-90 78 62
9-28-90 81 60
9-29-90 75 59
9-30-90 69 57

Methodist

Conference
The annual meeting of the 

McLean United Methodist 
Church membership will be 
held on Wednesday evening 
October 10th. Beginning 
with a covered dish dinner at 
6:30, the evening will 
continue with devotional 
time and a business meet­
ing. District Superintendent 
Rev. Jo Carr will preside at 
the meeting as we come 
together to see where our 
community of faith has come 
during the past year and 
what we seek to achieve for 
God in the Body of Christ 
during the coming year. 
Hope to see as many church 
members as possible!

124 yards. Kusmng for 4 
TD's was Dennis Hill.

Tuffy Sanders scored on 
an 11 yard run and had 3 
conversion kicks. Daniel 
Harris brought one home 
from one yard out in other 
scoring.

Neit week McLean will 
face off with Valley at 7:30 
p.m.

Girls

Football To Be 

Held Monday

Monday, October 8th at
6:30 p.m. the McLean High 
School Student Council is 
sponsoring a High School 
Girls Flag Football game. 
During halftime there will be
* performance by elemen­
tary students and Corona­
tion of a senior citizen king 
and queen. King candidates 
are L.L. Rogers, Jesse O. 
Coleman and J.W . 
Meacham. Queen candi­
dates are Margaret 
Coleman, Fern Boyd and 
Ruth Magee. The king and 
queen will be determined by 
money donations placed in 
jars at various businesses. 
All proceeds will go to the 
MHS Stiudent Council.

Precipitation for the week
1.70

McLean Briefs

Shaley Stalls of McLean is 
in Coronado Community 
Hospital in Pampa. She was 
working out at gymnastics 
on Sunday evening and 
broke a bone in her arm. At 
press time, she was still in 
the hospital recovering after 
surgery.

J. Boyd Smith and Ken 
Blanchard attended the 
cook out at “ Chevron” out of 
Pampa on the Borger High­
way, Saturday, Sept. 29th.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Haynes 
and Dan Fish visited Dollie 
Haynes at Oklahoma Univer­
sity last Saturday and 
attended the OU-Kansas 
fo o tb a l l  g am e . •

REMNDER!
McLEAN COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR

Broom SaletThe Lion’s 
Club will be holding their 
annual broom sale begin­
ning Oct. 5 at 8:00 a.m. at 
Lion’s Club building. This 
will run through Oct. 16th. 
On Oct. 15th at 5:00 p.m. 
they will go from door to 
door. This is made possible 
by the “ Light House for the 
Blind and Our Lion’s Club. .

The Alanreed School
Parent Teacher Organization 
has set Saturday, October 
27, for the Alanreed PTO 
Com m unity H allow een 
Carnival at 6:30 p.m.

Notice-Public Hearing on
the 1990-91 Budget for he 
City of McLean will be held 
October 11, 1990 at 7:00 
p.m.
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McLean BriefsPage 8-THF. GR( OM NEWS
Thursday. Octo >er 4,1990

J.B., Patricia and Greg 
Sanderson fron Amarillo 
visited Bobby. Robby and 
Amanda Sander;on over the 
weekend and a'tended the 
singing at the f  ssembly of 
God Church.

Mary Lou Glass went to 
Fort Worth on Friday 
evening to visit Jamie Glass, 
Terry and Joe Luna at 
Waxahachie. Mary Dale and 
Linsey were to be there over 
the weekend too.

A special welcome to Bud 
and Bonnie Sutton of San 
Diego, Calif, who have 
retired and returned here to 
make McLean their home. 
Their daughter, La Neca, of 
San Diego, Calif, is 
presently visiting them.

Alanreed News

Visiting the Hartley Davis 
family Saturday were Mr. 
and Mrs. Willis May of 
Panhandle and Velma 
Heckler of San Antonio. 
Velma remained for a longer 
visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Bruce were in Galveston 
during the weekend at a 
family reunion of Mrs. 
Bruces’ family.

The R. L. Leeder family 
had his two sisters from 
Florida visiting this week.

The Dick Dragoo family 
had his sister and her 
husband from Loveland 
visiting this week.

The recent rainfall 
averaged an inch and one- 
half over most of our area.

R. L. Leeder was in 
Amarillo on business this 
week.

Don’t forgot our Commu­
nity Improvement Meeting 
Saturday night at 7:00 p.m. 
at the School Cafetorium. It 
will be a covered dish. 
Program by Jeanette Fish.

DPS Report
Capt. Rusty Davis, Dis­

trict Supervisor of the 
Amarillo Highway Patrol 
District comprising of 31 
counties said, “ For the 
month of August, our 
troopers investigated seven 
fatal accidents, 68 personal 
injury accidents, and % 
property damage accidents. 
There were nine persons 
killed and 104 persons 
injured in these accidents.”

Sgt. James Powell of 
Pampa stated, “ In Gray 
county, our troopers investi­
gated no fatal accidents, 
seven personal injury 
accidents and seven 
property damage accidents 
in the month of August. No 
persons were killed and 14 
persons were injured in 
these accidents.”

Tony Smitherman is in 
Veterans Hospital in 
Amarillo. Tony became ill 
about noon on Monday and 
was taken by car to the 
hospital. He is suffering 
from a heart problem and 
double pneumonia and at 
press time it was reported 
that his condition was about 
the same.

CARD OF THANKS

Many thanks to all who 
worked in restoring the “ Old 
Phillips 66”  station in 
McLean. Many hours of 
labor: both professional and 
amateur; the paint, tires and 
shingles made the station a 
real historical building for 
the whole community. We 
really appreciate it all.

The McLean Old 
Route 66 Association

Defensive

Driving Course

A Defensive Driving 
course will be held at 
Clarendon College on 
Saturday, October 13, 1990. 
It will meet from 8:00 a.m. to 
5:00 p.m. in room 101. The 
fee is $25.00. Please contact 
Clarendon College at 
1-806-874-3571 for further 
information. Upon comple­
tion of this course, partici­
pants will be eligible for a 10 
percent discount on their 
liability insurance or 
dismissal of a traffic viola­
tion. All dismissals of traffic 
violations must be approved 
by the appropriate Justice of 
Peace.

Country Comer 
Texaco TEXACO

SUNDAY SPECIAL:
Swiss strak, scalloped potaotes,

greet, beans, salad, .
& chess pie. $3*99
Cc II In Orders Welcome 

Cou itry Burgers Everyday

EXIT 142 McLean 779-2391

ELE3T

JB \N
MARTINDALE

31st J Jdicial 

District Judge

a* aw Ad». by ■> sumum t» am om u ta<g>, — wtr. > 
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Hambright Building Supplies 

will close as of October IS, 1990.

We thank our customers for  
their patronage through the years

All Accounts are due and payable.

M cLean, Texas

Good Luck
McLean Tigers

Valley
There - October 5 -

We Are A ll Behind You!
Simpson Insurance Agency

Jasper Hoofing C & H Supply, Inc. ,
Johnnie & Colleen Cowboy Cafe

9

McLean Pharmacy Corinne's Style Shop Mertel Boot Shop

Bank Of Commerce El Paso Natural Gas Co. B & B  Electric

James I iefley Auction Co. Lamb Flower Shop Puckett's Grocery

Country Comer Texaco Alberta's Beauty Shop The McLean News 

Richard son Texaco Hambright Building Supplies B & B  Turbine

McLean Hardware Taylor Food Mart Magee Ranch
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MCLEAN ISD MENU

Oct. 4, Than:Breakfast- 
Cream beef, toast, juice, 
milk

Lunch-Soft Tacos with 
cheese, salad, pinto beans, 
sopillias. honey, milk 

Oct. 5, Frt:Breakfast-Cold 
cereal, toast, juice, milk 

L unch-F ish  n u g g e ts , 
tartar sauce, cole slaw, 
macaroni and cheese, corn- 
bread, fruit, milk 

Oct. 8, Mon:Breakfast-hot 
cereal, biscuits, juice, milk 

Lunch-Pizza, salad, corn, 
cake, milk

Oct. 9, Tues.-Breakfast-
Cinnamon rolls, fruit, juice, 
milk

Lunch-Stuffed potatoes

SIX-MAN SCORES 
OF INTEREST

Amherst 22, Wilson 18 
Chillicothe 51, Lefors 19 
Groom 30, Cotton 

Center 0
Guthrie 56, Silverton 22 
Lazbuddie 48, Agape 

Christian 0
McLean 42. Harrold 6 

Valley 54. Miami 44

with meat and cheese, 
buttered carrots, bread 
sticks, whipped jello, milk 

Oct. 10, Wed:Breakfast
Scrambled eggs, biscuits, 
juice, milk

Lunch-Corn dogs, french 
fries, carrot sticks, fruit, 
cookies, milk

Oct. 4, ThurstBreakfast- 
Pancakes. fruit, juice, milk 

Lunch*Hamburgers, 
french fries, lettuce and 
tomatoes, mustard, fruit, 
milk

Oct. 12, FriiBreakfast-
Cold cereal, toast, juice, 
milk

Lunch-Chicken nuggets, 
cream gravy, green beans, 
mashed potatoes, hot rolls, 
butter, honey, milk

M ichael W ooldridge 
(professional truck opera­
tions) of McLean recently 
graduated from Texas State 
Technical Institute-Amarillo 
in the summer quarter with 
a certificate of completion.

Texas State Technical 
Institute-Amarillo is a non­
profit technical college, 
created in 1970 by the Texas 
Legislature. The school 
offers 16 technical programs 
ranging from laser electro­
optics to welding.

Your School
by Rex Peeple s

I have been asked fror i 
time to time question! 
concerning the eligibility cf 
students participating in ou r
a th le tics . If ev er  w e are In 
doubt concerning a situa­
tion. we immediately call tl e 
University Interscholastic 
League (UIL) in Austin foi a 
correct interpretation of a 
given rule. Also, the sams 
situation is discussed within 
our district executi re 
committee, which is all tie  
superintendents in t ie 
district, for their input aid  
approval. Basically t tie 
questions normally arising 
relate to the students 
residence. The rule is very 
clear on this and it states he 
following: An individual is 
eligible to participate ii a 
league varsity athle tic

contest as a representative 
of a participant school if he 
has been continuously enrol­
led in and regularly attend­
ing the school for at least the 
previous calendar vear if his
p aren ts d o  not res id e  w ithin  
th e  schoo l d istrict’s  a tten d ­
an ce zon e .

A student cannot transfer 
in and be eligible to partici- 
pate in UIL activities the 
same year.

If a student has been 
going to school here at 
McLean for at least one 
year, and then his family 
moves to another district, 
the student will be eligible to 
play if they get legally 
transferred and if they do 
not enter another school.

If you have questions 
concerning any UIL rules, 
please contact a school 
official.

DEANS
2217 Pemrtor Parkway

p h a r m a c y

• Parkway 669-6896

Looking forward 
to serving our 

Groom customers. 
Ask about our 
mail service.

Welcome Welfare Recipients

Specic l Discounts 
to Senior Citizens on all 

Prescriptions.
D ean C ope land  
Home 665-2698

lim  T. P ep p er 
B isincss 669-6896 Home 669-9710

STATE UNEMPLOYMENT
RATE FINALLY FALLS

‘‘We finally got a break,” 
Commissioner Mary Scott 
Nabers of the Texas Employ­
ment Commission said today 
as unemployment figures for 
the state were released. The 
5.9 percent recorded for the 
month is the lowest we have 
seen since March of this 
year."

The state’s jobless rate 
declined from 6.3 percent 
where it had remained for 
the past two months and was 
well below last year’s rate of 
7.2 percent.

Nabers explained that 
much of the decrease was 
due to the fact that summer 
jobseekers withdrew from 
the labor force. “ However,” 
Nabers said, "there are still 
half a million Texans who 
are unemployed and while 
that number is 100,000 less 
than last year, we still have a 
way to go.”

Areas with highest 
August rates included: 
McAllen-Edinburg- 
Mission. with a rate of 15.9 
percent; Brownsville- Harlin­
gen, at 10.8 percent; El 
Paso, at 10.2 percent; 
Laredo, with 8.7 percent; 
and Beaumont-Port 
Arthur, with a 7.4 percent 
August rate.

Counties of local interest 
are:Armstrong-C.L.F.
I, 082, Emp. 1,023, Unemp. 
59. Rate 5.5

C arson-C .L .F . 4,326, 
Emp. 4,203, Unemp. 123, 
Rate 2.8

D onley-C .L .F . 1,925, 
Emp. 1,873, Unemp. 52, 
Rate 2.7

Gray-C.L.F. 12,281, Emp.
I I .  748, Unemp.-533. Rate
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SAVINGS

Quitting Business!
Sale Starts Friday, Oct. 5

Special Hours

Friday, 7:30 a.m. ■ 9:00 p.m.

Saturday, 8:00 a.m. ■ 7:00 p.m. 

Sunday -1:00 p.m. - 6:00p.m .

Shoes
UP TO 60%  Boots

Handbags

Our Famous Brands

r3 ? n
. E MT IRE 'ir<)U'

. JOVcs S h 0£i

Ewr/lo SfBQ

/»/u4J
*  ' u r W ;

2 T
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All Shoes 

Regular Stock

No Special Purchase 
No Gimmicks 

No Layaways 
All Sales Final

BUTIIte. S W  o e t il irtlftt
C o n n ie  ia iJ ^ th r e ^

U £ 5DZ
/ /  ? UA Hin f i / y i i l l  

Pb.*y\p*

■ S n ^ a # a d ia i^ 5 t t io b (e a
and;

Torque? You’ll be lucky if it doesn’t  pull into 
next week when you put it in gear.

Cummins turbo diesel. If you’ve ever heard 
those three words, you know what we’re 
talking about.

We build Dodge Ram pickups around 5.9 
liters of fury that crank out 400 lb.-ft. torque. 
Which incidentally, kicks tailgate on all other 
diesel pickups.

With that kind of heavy muscle you’d figure 
you’d have to auction off your fillings to pay your 
tab at the pumps.

Not true. The Dodge Cummins Turbo Diesel gets 
the best mileage of any diesel pickup! It also 
accelerates fastest and does the best job handling 
mountainous loads a t mountainous elevations!

We know we don’t  have to tell you what to do 
with all this power. But we would like to ask you 
to use it responsibly. For instance, be careful when 
crossing a state line, particularly if you’re leaving 
one of the smaller states. You want to make sure 
you’re not taking most of it with you by mistake-

1991 Cummins Diesel
Now In Stock

Robert Knowles
Dodge, Chrysler, Plymouth 
833 W. Foster - 665-6544

The tough new ipint of Dodge.

1 -800-999-5075
Dodge Truths
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MCLEAN BIRTH >AYS
AND ANNIVERS/JUES

Oct. 8-Kisha R gsby, 
Beulah Rigsby

Oct. 9-Frank Worsham, 
Mrs. T.T. Griffin. Jessie 
Watson. Ronald Vernon 
Kennedy

Oct. 10-Lois Bentl -y, Ruth 
Whaley. Emmett Allen

Oct. 11-Ann Brown. 
Roger McCracken, f largaret 
Coleman

Oct. 12-Jay D* e Fish, 
Leland Myers, Betty 
Skipper. Jonathan Bailey. 
George Burrow, Stacy 
Phillips

Oct. 13-Johnnit Mertel, 
Arnold Sharp

Oct. 14-Billy Bob Terry

We are happy to report 
Dick Wheeler has returned 
home from the hospital.

Mr. A.L. Welch is in the 
hospital in Pampa. we wish 
him a speedy recovery.

Several residents attend­
ed Sunday school in the 
morning. In the afternoon 
Bro. Claude Peach, pastor of 
the Pentecostal Church was 
here to conduct services.

Residents playing bingo 
Monday afternoon were 
Kittie Hessey. Adelle 
Walker, Pauline Miller, 
Lucy Skipper, Mattie 
Wheeler. Leon Burch, Mary 
Helen Boston, Eula Morrow, 
Lillie Knox, Teresa Richard­
son, Monnie Matthews, 
Mary Sligar, John Meyers, 
Clyde Trusty, Francis 
Kennedy and Annie Eudey . 
Our helpers were Sylvia 
McClellan, Avalee Crockett

and Loree Barker. Bananas 
were furnished by the Lions' 
Club.

R e s id e n ts  p la y in g  
dominos Tuesday afternoon 
were Leon Burch, Eula 
Morrow, Teresa Richardson 
and Imogene King. Our 
helpers were Lena Carter 
and Mary Davis.

Wednesday afternoon 
members of the Pentecostal 
Church were here for a 
sing-a-long.

Thursday morning the 
residents enjoyed the donuts 
furnished by Leta Mae Hess. 
In the afternoon the follow­
ing residents attended our 
current events program: Ida 
Shull, Lucy Skipper, Lula 
Sheegog, Thelma Hopkins, 
Stella Gibson, Lucille 
Cullison, Dick and Mattie 
W heeler, Lillie Knox, 
Teresa Richardson and 
Kittie Hessey. Refresh­
ments were served following 
the session.

A special thank you to the 
following volunteers for 
being here during my 
absence: Avalee Crockett, 
Sylvia McClellan, Loree 
Barker and Cliffie Heasley 
for doing the bingo. Mary 
Davis and Lena Carter for 
helping in dominos and 
Louise Turner for delivering 
the donuts and also spend­
ing the day mending the 
residents clothes.

JASPER ROOFING AND 
CONSTRUCTION

C O M M E R C IA L  A R E S ID E N T IA L  
20 Y u r t  Exptrltnco

free tstim ate t References Guaranteed 

Repairs, Iteroofs, Hot Tar, Cedar, 

Shakes, Composition l  Metal

1-779-2329 Rickie Jasper

© A c e

Look at ole Jake, he’ll do a day’s work 
in a week, most anytime!”

McLean
Texas

BANK OF 
COMMERCE

A Subsidiary of GrayCo Banc Shares, Inc.

m useum  goals
and  PURPOSES

by D. Ryan Smith, Director

With this column, the 
Panhandle-Plains Historical 
Museum staff is inaugurat­
ing a series of articles about 
the collections, research, 
exhibits and programs of the 
Museum. Each will be 
written by a curator, 
archivist or other staff 
member reflecting his or her 
personal point of view. Our 
hope is that you will become 
more acquainted and thus 
more involved with the 
Museum and our projects. _ 
Since the 1920s, the 
Panhandle-Plains Historical 
Society and the Museum 
have been very active 
throughout the Texas 
Panhandle in collecting and 
presenting our past; indivi­
duals across the region have 
helped in recovering fossil 
remains, geologic and 
b io lo g ic a l  s p e c im e n s , 
ethnographic materials and 
historical collections. For 
over fifty years, people like 
you have been generously 
giving their time and 
support to this institution. 
To continue this rich tradi­
tion of support and excellent 
rapport between the 
community and the 
Museum, we simply want to 
provide you with a little 
extra insight into our current 
activities as well as our 
dreams.

As I said earlier, each 
column will be written from 
a familiar, personal point of 
view and will reflect our 
professional and personal 
ph ilo so p h ies . R ecently , 
m uch o f our ph ilosophy w as  
e x h i b i t e d  in  a lon g  range  
planning document. T h e  
plan revolved around three 
main areas: improving the 
M useum’s support base 
with increased >member- 
ships, increased marketing 
efforts, and increased 
d e v e lo p m e n t e f f o r ts ;  
enhancing our interpretive 
programs through renovat­
ing the permanent exhibits 
and expanding our educa­
tional programming; and

PUBLIC NOTICE

BoB Clements, Inc.
Fine Tailoring, Dry Cleaning, Custom Windows 

1437 N. Hobart 665-5121
A member of the Intenwion.! Fabric wr Institute.
the association of professional drycleaner, and launderen

One Hour Martinizing
Bring your cleaning when you shop

in Pam pa .......
Pick it up the same day!!!!

Two locations to serve you- 

1807 N. Hobart-1824 W. Francis

fc
— M—  X "■ M M

flOwhoAfaiil moron c o m p a n y

HIGHWAY 287 ClARENDON. TEXAS

BUICK • OLDSMOBILE

PONTIAC • CADILLAC »GMC TRUCKS 
Susan Brown Clarendon |806| 874-3527
248-6241
Groom, Texaa 79039

Amarillo 376-9041
Texas WATS 1800) 692-4068 

“  “  “
The City of McLean has 

been notified by the Texas 
Department of Health that 
the water being supplied by 
our system exceed the fol­
lowing maximum consti­
tuent level for Nitrate speci­
fied by the Department 
“ Drinking Water stand­
ards” which were promul­
gated as required by the 
“ Safe Drinking Water Act,” 
Public Law 93-523<U.S.). 
The limit is set at 10 
milligrams of Nitrate (as 
nitrogen) per liter of water. 
The amount of Nitrate (as 
nitrogen in the water to be 
11.95 milligrams per liter.

Adults and children over 
the age of 6 months need not 
be concerned about drinking 
water from the tap. An 
excess Nitrate intake by an 

infant under the age of 6 
months may reduce its avail­
able oxygen supply and pos­
sibly produce “blue baby” 
symptons. Parents are 
advised to find other sources 
of drinking water, such as 
bottled water, for their 
infants under 6 months of 
age. All doctors and hospi­
tals in the area have been 
notified of this situation.

Book your 

Seed Wheat Now I

We have several 

varieties available.
Contact Mice or Bob.

We appreciate the 
opportunity to serve you.

ATTEBURY GRAIN, Inc. j

248-7591 Groom, Texas
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Political
Calendar

th e  GROOM NEWS 
THE McLEAN NEWS

All ads cash with' order 
unless customer has an 
established account with 
The Groom or McLean 
News.

For Sale: 24 foot house­
boat $3500.00 or best offer. 
Call 248-73%. „

Boy M ulti-Peril Crop 
Insurance on wheat and 
other small grains. Closing 
date is September 30. 
Brumley Insurance Agency.

Vivian'* Floweru-Groom,
Texas. Contrary to rumor. I 
still do make casket sprays, 
your choice of flowers, 
delivered anywhere you 
want $75 to $100 and up. 
Special pieces $30 and up on 
easel. $15 and up sprays. 
Blooming plants and green 
plants $15 to $17.50 and 
$20.00 and up.

Oae B e d ro o m  Trailer
House for rent, furnished 
see at Bill and Sam’s Trailer 
Park or Call 248-7048.

Why RenlT Homes for 
$1.00. Repos. Gov’t give 
away programs! For infor­
mation 504-649-0670 Ext 
R-1725.

Far Sales Concert Grand 
Upright Piano. $300 00 or
best offer. Call 248-7395 or 
248-7048.

Whea
8 0 6 -8 7 4 -3 2 8 5
874-3123.

wanted.
or

Shamrock Slaughter Plant 
Coatom Slaughtering

1/2 beef, beef cuts, & pork 
Food Stamp* Accepted

Open
Monday through Friday 

Closed 
Saturday 

Phone 256-3241

Wanted Craft Persons:
Tooths available at S10. 
*1 ables and chairs provided. 
Holiday Bazaar. St. Mary’s 
Catholic Hall. Saturday, 
Nov. 17th, 9:30 a.m. to 12 
roon. Contact Doris Homer, 
Tox 550, Groom 79039, • 
248-7492.................

G arage Sale-W om ens
c othes sizes 4 to 12, girls 
c othes, mens clothes, size 
I 5 shirt. 30 levis. Start 9:00 
a m. Saturday at Lonnie 
Brown’s home. Sale by 
J lanita Brown.

Wanting Wheal pasture. 
C ill 874-3123.

Seed Wheat for sale: TAM 
2(0. regular and certified, 
c le a n e d . B in  R u n  a lso .D a n  
S te e d . 248-7982. n.

For Sale: 15 Foot Fiber- 
t lass fishing boat , 40 
H orsepow er, E verrude  
notor.new controls,$550.00
cr best offer. Call 248-7395.

Typist - $500.00 weekly at 
h ime! Information: Send
s :lf-addressed, stamped 
envelope. Honey, P.O. Box 
6 i09, Charlottesville, VA. 
2 >906............

For Sale-20 W.W. 
p triable 10 feet stock panels 
in good condition. $45 each. 
Bill Homer. 248-7564.

STOP N SH OP
248 7977 Grotm  TEXACO

[Everyone’s  Comenience Store

Before work or after 
the game, 

the coffeepot is 
always on.

"Your Hometown Store"

Political Calendar
The McLean News is 

authorized to present, the 
names of the following can­
didates for office, subject to 
the General Election on 
November 6, 1990. A fee of 
$35 has been paid by each 
candidate for listing in this 
column from now through 
the election.

Democrat
223rd Judicial Dlatrict

Court Judge
Lee Waters

Justice of the Peace
Gray County No. 4

•R. C. Parker

District Judge of 31st
Judicial District 

Democrat
M. Kent Sims

Jean A. Mariindale 
Gray County Clerk

Wanda Carter

Gray County Judge
Jim Osborne

Gray County Treasurer
Flaine Cooper

•D e n o te s  In c u m b e n t

Democrat 
State House of 

Representatives 
84th District

Warren Chisum

Now Selling

Multi-Peril 
Crop Insurance

The Groom News is 
authorized to present the 
names of the following 
candidates for office, subject 
to the General Election on 
November 6, 1990. A fee of 
$35 has been paid by each 
candidate for listing in this 
column from now through 
th e  e le c t io n .

DEMOCRAT

For Carson County Judge:
•Jay R. Roselius 

For Carson Co. Treasurer: 
•Peggy Butler 

For Carson Co. Treasurer: 
•Peggy Butler 

For Tax Assessor-Collector: 
Donita Herber'

REPUBLICAN 
For U.S. Rep., Dist. 13:

Dick Waterfield 
•Denotes-lncumbent

WRITE-IN
For lax Assessor-Collector:
•Rosalyn Watson

Democrat
State Representative 

88th District
Guy Hazlett

Three Family garage sale,
715 E. 2nd. Friday, Oct. 5 
through Saturday. Oct. 6. 
9:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
Weather permitting.

For Rent: Nice 3 bedroom, 
fresh paint and new carpet.
B ig  y a r d  a n d  g a r a g e .  
$ 250 .00  a m o n th , d a m a g e  
d e p o s it  re q u ire d  $150.00. 
Contact Royce Brown 
248-7291.

For Sale: 800 Ford
Tractor. 500 gal Propane

Pav's Service
C om e See Us

For Your Automotive Needs!

Oil-Batteries 
Complete Line Of Tires 

& Service
Wholesale Deliveries 

Retail-Regular-Unleaded

M o n - S a t . , 7 :00  a .m . to 6 :00  p.m.

Carson County A bstract Co. 
Realtors, Abstractors of Titles

222 Main St. 537-3561 Panhandle, Texas

■ C U ST O M '
SWATHING AND BALING

Sm all  sq u a re  bales an d  
la ’T.e ro u n d  bales. 

~ N . C ustom  /tin n in g .

L arry  B e n n e tt
8 7 4 -5 0 0 8

W e Repair All 
K inds ol

RADIATORS
•P la s tic  •A lum inum  
•Copper «B ra ss

665-0190 or 1-800-762-6381
Automotive-Industrial 

JO HN & C A R O LYN  S T O K E S -O W N E R S  
S2S W. Brow n

Hwy 60-Pampa, Tx. 
Open Saturday M orn ings

665-0190
IF NO ANSWER 665-7894

Tank, 2-wheel stock trailer,
a 2042.MCLEAN LODGE

> 0 4 ^  No. 889 
V  4 1 4  AM

Stated Meeting 
2nd Thursday 

Practice Every Monday 
7:30 p.m.

The McLean /  Alanreed
Museum will receive bids for 
insurance coverage on build­
ing in downtown McLean. 
$35,000.00 hail, fire and

VISITORS WELCOME 
Olln J. Weldon, W.M. 

J. Boyd Smith, Secretary

wind damage. 50,000.00 
liability. For further infor­
mation. call 779-2935 or 
779-2268.

BIVENS AUTOMOTIVE

MARK BIVENS 
(806) 2487010

24 HOUR WRECKER SERVICE 
HWY 66 & TEXAS 

GROOM. TX 79039 
(806) 248-7471 JACK BIVENS 

(806) 248-7966

Swanson Construction
Remodeling-Additions-New 

Home Construction-All Concrete 
\Vork-Metal and Asphalt 
Roofing-Ceramic Tiling* 

Carports-Cabinets 
Call Larry at 779-3101 or -2950

Brumley Insurance 
Agency

GROOM, TEXAS
J o h n n y  B rum ley, A g e n t  ^  

Office 248-7550 Home 248-731

QUARLES BODY SHOP
Body Pick Up & Delivery i Painting

Frame within 30 miles All Work 

Rick Quarles, Owner Guaranteed

Bus:806-835-2523 Res: 806-835-2939

100 E. 10th P.O. Box 371 Lefors, Tex. 79054
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Powder Puff

Wednesday was the 
elementary kids pep rally. 
This is an event that every­
one looks forward to. 
Classes K th ough 6 are 
allowed to strut their stuff 
and show that they, too, 
have school s|>irit. Lots of 
pyramids and skits were 
done. The f r  twite cheers 
seemed to b i  “ Rock-the- 
Field” and “ Eounce to the 
ounce.” Teaciers in the 
lower grades are to be 
commended or the cute skits 
they did.

Thursday irought the 
opening Jr. High Game and 
pep rally. Junk e High cheer­
leaders filled in at the J.V. 
game as hi|>h schoolers 
prepared for the bonfire. 
Cubs beat Sil/erton 39-12. 
J.V. won b< ating Lefors 
38-0.

Halftime acivity was the 
"slave action.” Coach Lamb 
was one oi the most

generous bidders. "Slaves” 
were seen Friday doing 
menial chores like carrying 
hooks for some of the lower 
classmen.

The bonfire topped off the 
days’ events. It was one of 
the largest in recent history 
and could be seen for miles. 
The local fire department 
was on hand in the event it 
got out of hand.

Friday dawned a dreary 
day that was brightened by 
waves of red, white and 
black as everyone decked 
out in their “ Spirit” outfit. 
The sun shown briefly as the 
entire school marched down 
town for the pep rally led by 
a police escort. Steve Hutsell 
and Coach Kennedy gave 
the pep talks. The band 
played the school song and 
the fight song.

The weeks' activities 
came to an end with the 
Queen Coronation, Game 
and Homecoming dance.

The victorious Tigers beat 
Cotton Center Elks 30-0. 
Soggy as it was Home- 
,coming 1990, “ Night of 
Dreams” was enjoyed by all.

OCTOBER CLINIC 
SCHEDULE

Immunization Clinic offer­
ing vaccines that give 
protection against several 
childhood diseases is 
scheduled for October 9, 
1990, from 4 to 7 p.m. at 
Groom Area Clinic. Protec­
tion is against Polio, 
Diphtheria, Lock Jaw 
(Tetanus), whooping cough 
( P e r t u s s i s ) ,  M e a s l e s ,  
Rubella and Mumps.

The Texas Department of 
Health is charging money to 
help with the cost of keeping 
the clinic open. The amount 
of money charged will be 
based on family income and 
size, and the ability to pay.

GROOM BIRTHDAYS
AND ANNIVERSARIES

Oct. 8-Mrs. Howard Glen 
Britten, Bryan Thomas 
Bichsel

Oct. 9-Mrs. Richard M. 
Crump, Morris A. (Cobb) 
Britten, Lance M. Ollinger

Oct. 10-Mrs. Anthony C. 
(Tony) Britten, Cody Ryan 
Bivens

Oct 11-W illiam Lucas 
P av lo v sk y , John E. Homer, 
Mr. and Mrs. Steven T.
Anthony ^  c

Oct. 12-Mrs. Curds t .
W hatley. N ath*n , e ie h W eiberg. Tam era Le.gh

ASOrt!dl3-Mrs. Wallace L. 
Bichsel, M rs. John D’

H 0 , '^  U-M-s.
Talley

Glynn D and Sybil Harrell 
and Elsie Eschle. Jim and 
Beverly Ingram of Amarillo 
attended the morning 
service of First United 
M ethodist Church and 
visited in the home of 
Glynda, Johnny and Darren 
Eschle in Lubbock on 
Sunday. Johnny is a member 
of the 100 member choir.

Among those from Groom 
attending Pioneer D,. 
activities at Panhandle 
Saturday were: Glynn D 104 
Sybil Harrell: Mike *04 
Marla Britten and children; 
Nell Britten: Angie Britten; 
and Irene Kotara.

e x c e l l e n c e  
t h r o u g h  e x pe r ie n c e

Tax Assessor-Collector and Voter 
Registrar o f Carson County 
16 years in Carson Co. Tax Office,
5 of those as Chief Deputy 
3 yrs. of college education; 54 yrs. 
of age; 33 yrs. as Carson Co. resident

Carsoim  County
Tax Assessor-Collector

November 6th General Election

M . Adv. Pd by RoaJyn Wanon. Bos Ml. Panhaodk TX D M

Small towns to pay for more
of Amarillo's Property Taxes.

P r t c * 7 5 a

Sunday, S e p w n b w 30,1990 A m a rH to jM M .
6 Sections

City sales tax-- - -  t
bv another halt cem
Amarillo sales lax rate to rise W s r a c m

taid. . __ tn « ner- enues. _Motion,”

City merch*?tSofŴ b u S ?  
hi&8er bemuse they will be

^  r J l V t o  8'A percent, or Stt 
dollar b u y ^  spend 

cents for ev«Y goods in the city, 
purchasing tax % in Am-

However.,4*  «de* ux ^

" " T h e y ’ve alre*dy Jrith
cent in most wmnwmtK*^. ^  ^

t ,s : = a , i a s n s 5 s
r S ^ e  s K  be one of the

property tax Ward said,
lowest in the state. tax rate

The — S y S f f c m a O A

enues. „„~tion.” Ward
“ There’s no q i<>west of

said. "We were already tne ^  
the largest 20 cities than
40 4 cents. Now

1989*90For example, Aman^ 4 ^  ^
property tax r*leiic lnwcr that Dallas’ 
V100 valuation was to w 00
1989-90 rate <>f^  S i  that
valuation. So rate will
Amarillo’s new property ____

WHITE DEER PANHANDLE

jesigned to

Business From Area Towns 
Appreciated In Amarillo?

CLAUDE
"Our small towns need Tax Dollars too I We have our school, city 

and county needs, and it is deplorable to pay SALE TAX in Amarillo 

at the new 8 'A percent rate. Spend your dollars at home and 

enable local businesses to expand like the Big Town.

BENEFIT FROM TOUR T U  DOLLARS

SHOP YOUR HOMETOWN FIRST!


