
Bill And Sam’s Enterprises Expand
To  BBQ, Garage, And Laundry

Groom is getting two nev 
businesses thsnks to th : 
expansion of Bill and Sara s 
Enterprises. Grand openin { 
for ’ 'B ill and Sam’ i 
Bar-B-Que" and “ Bill an 1 
Sam's Laundry”  was Sep'. 
4th.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Rile y 
have lived in Groom since 
1907 when they purchase! 
the. then called. L.A. Mote . 
Mr. Riley is retired from 
Coca-Cola Co. They run all 
their businesses themselve ■. 
“ Sam's the brains and I'm 
the maintenance man." sa d 
BUI. These include BUI ard 
Sam’s Bar. Motel. Laundiy, 
Auto Repair and Trailer 
Park.

The latest addition, t ie  
Bar-B-Quc, will open at 6: )0 
a.m. Bill wUI be doing t le 
cooking and invites everyo le 
out to sample his speciali­
ties. The laundry will >e

open for business from 6:00 
a.m. until 10:00 p.m. daUy.

The Riley’s have five 
children. They are all grown 
and out on their own except 
Connie who helps run the 
motel. The others are Gary. 
Ginny. Jimmy and Pattie. 
An interesting personal note

about Mrs. Riley...She was

Groom Tiger’s officially 
kick-off their 1990 season 
this Friday night at 7:00 
p.m.. facing opponents from 
Alamo Catholic School of 
Amarillo.

• TCB”  or “ Taking Care 
of Business”  has become 
the theme of team members 
during the two pre-season 
scrimmages. The meaning 
of the phrase is descriptive

born in E. Germany where 
she met and married BiU 
who was Marine guarding 
the American Embassy 
there. The day after the 
Berlin Wall came down she 
received a call from a sister 
that she thought had been 
killed by the Russians. It had 
been over thirty years since 
she heard from her.

of how every player intends 
to play. Each one wUI be 
doing his individual best to 
do his job as part of the 
team.

Senior Robert MUler said. 
“ This should be a fun 
season I Football in Groom 
should keep getting better 
and better!”  Being one of 
the “ Old”  men on a rela- 

See Football, Pg. 4

Season Kicks O ff Friday

City Water 
Expansion

Mayor A1 Homer and 
Councifmen Jimmy Britten 
and Bill Homer met last 
week with interested parties 
about how soon to begin 
work on Groom’s water 
system. The work is made 
possible by a grant designed 
to help cities meeting 
specific criteria.

The group meeting was 
held to let each interested 
group know how work was 
expected to proceed. In case 
of unforseen problems each 
will know who to call and 
how to get in touch with 
them.

Work is expected to begin 
on October 1 at the fire 
hydrant on the south corner 
of the school. “ The work, 
when finished, will upgrade 
our fire rating with the State 
Fire Marshall's Office and 
hopefully lower property fire 
insurance,”  said City 
Secretary Pat Ashford. 
Depending on the weather 
the work will be finished in 
180 days. Residents will not 
be inconvenienced by the 
work as all streets and drive­
ways will be bored, rather 
than ditched. Mayor A1 
Homer said. “ We are look­
ing forward to getting 
started.”

Groups represented were 
See Water, Pg. 3

AFTER GAME PARTIES

All Junior High Students 
are invited to the after game 
fellowship for food, games 
and fun at the Church of 
Christ.

All High School students 
are invited to the Baptist 
Church for after the game 
activities 1

NOTICE

The City of Groom has 
been notified by B.F.I. that 
they will not be allowed to 
pick up tires in garbage 
unless they are shredded.

A Defensive Driving
course will be held at 
Clarendon College on 
Saturday. September 8, 
1990. It will meet from 8:00 
a.m. to 5:00 p.m. in room 
101. The fee is S25.00. 
Please contact Clarendon 
College at 1-806-874-3571 
for further information. 
Upon completion of this 
course, participants will be 
eligible for a 10 percent 
discount on their liability 
insurance or dismissal of a 
traffic violation. All 
dismissals of traffic viola­
tions must be approved by 
the appropriate Justice of 
Peace.

Country Neighbors - will 
meet Sept. 12, 10:00 s.m. at 
Alice Kuehler home.

Troop 21 • Junior Girl 
Scouts will meet Thursday at 
5:00 p.m. in the Girl Scout 
Room at the Community 
Center. Any girl in the 4th, 
5th or 6th grade who would 
like to know more-bring 
parent to meeting or call 
Donna Burton 248-7453.

Chowlinc Mean! Sept. 7, 
Friday-Goulash, cabbage 
slaw, garlic breads dessert

Sept. 11, Tuesday:Fried 
chicken, gravy, french fries, 
salad, hot biscuits, dessert

Carson County Farm 
Bureau will hold its annual 
C ou n ty  C o n ven t io n , 
Tuesday, Sept. 18th at 7:30 
p.m. in the War Memorial 
Building. A barbecue dinner 
will be served. Bob Gibe ns 
of KGNC radio will be the 
guest speaker. Tickets are 
$5.00 per person.

TUESDAY GRAIN PRICES 

AT LOCAL ELEVATORS

Cash prices on grain 
posted at grain elevators 
serving the Groom area 
'Tuesday afternoon:

Wheat-S2.14 
Mllo-S3.75 
Corn-S3.95
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Evelyn Hubbart Named New 

Librarian For Groom
At a meeting on August 

27th of the Carson County 
Commissioner's Court, Mrs. 
Evelyn Hubbart was 
appointed Librarian of the 
Groom Branch of the Carson 
County Library to fill the 
vacancy created by the 
resignation of Mrs. Bertha 
Knight on July 31st.

Mrs. Hubbart has been 
the Library substitute for 3 
years and is also a member 
of Groom Library Friends. 
She has been a resident of 
this community 5 yean hav­
ing moved here from 
Amarillo to make a home for 
her mother, Mrs. Edna 
Russell, now a resident of 
St. Ann’ s Home in 
Panhandle.

Mrs. Hubbart enjoys 
reading, knitting and 
crocheting and traveling to 
see her two daughters in 
California and Ohio, five 
grandsons, two grand­
daughters, two great-grand­
daughters and one great- 
grandson.

Patrons are invited to visit 
the Library and to apply for a 
new card.

Mayor Homer 
Announces

( Community Calendar

C ro w  Athletic Boosters 
will meet immediately after 
Thursday night Junior 
Varsity Football game on the 
football field.

Please note change i
Baptist Church will host SOS 
on Sept. 20th. Church of 
Christ will host SOS in Oct.

( G t r a u t n  I f c t u s
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Local Happenings
Mark Bivens is currently 

attending Amarillo College. 
His name was inadvertently 
left off the college list.

Somehow Magan Bivens 
name was left off the 
September birthday list. We 
wish her a lovely birthday on 
September 6th.

Rip and Joy Snyder and 
Gloria Ledwig returned 
home Thursday after visiting 
a week in the home of Cobb, 
Kay, Joe and Frances 
Britten. They reported a 
wonderful time and 
Gothenburg is a lovely town.

HOSPITAL LIST

Mr. and Mrs. A1 Alward 
visited Bessie Mae Arnold 
Monday.

Jake and Vivian Lacy 
treated Roza Lopez to a 
Chinese dinner Sunday for 
her birthday at the Ming 
Palace in Amarillo.

They also visited their 
new  g ra n d d a u g h te r , 
Cheyenne Keeton Downy, 
born August 28th at North­
west Texas Hospital,

Magan Bivens had a mis­
hap Friday on the bumper 
cars at Wonderland Park. 
She had a hairline skull 
fracture. The family stayed 
over the weekend in 
Amarillo in case there were 
complications. Magan is the 
daughter o f Mark and 
Tammy Bivens.

SEPTEMBER CLINIC 
SCHEDULE

Postmaster:p ease send address changes to:
Box 460. Gr nm, TX-Phone 806-248-7333 
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Annual Rate Carsoi i County 514.00
Annual Rate elsew) ere in the United States $16.00

Mr. and Mrs. Max 
Summers came to the 
hospital in Amarillo to be 
with her father during his 
surgery. Linda stayed a 
week after his return home.

MEMBER 1990
T U
TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION

Mr. and Mrs. Neusch and 
sons of Panhandle were 
“ dove season”  visitors at 
the Don Case home Sunday.

THANK YOU

NEW RESIDENTS

Welcome to new n sidents 
Dick and Prissy Con ad and 
family. He is son of Louise 
Conrad. Dick was n ised in 
Groom. Prissy, fcrmerly 
Prissy England, a tended 
school here until their 
marriage. Dick will l «  driv­
ing back and forth to 
Amarillo where he is the 
managing pharma :ist at 
Pro-Med Pharmacy. Prissy 
taught at St. vfary's 
Montessori School a  id was 
Director of Preschoo.

Mrs. Conrad sa d that 
they were enjoying I ving in

Groom. What they really 
would like to do would be to 
build a home here. For now 
they are renting. to make 
sure that this is the right 
thing for them. They have 
always spent a lot of time 
here.

The Conrad’s have six 
children; Shelly, the oldest, 
is married to Sean Buttran 
and live in Arlington where 
he is attending University iof 
Texas . They have a baby 
named Drew; April, a fresh­
man; Tara, 7th grader; 
Amber. 6th grader; Spencer. 
3rd grader and Racheal who 
is four years old

Many thanks to everyone 
for the get well cards, the 
nice visits and the much 
needed prayers.

Marvin Morrow

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to express our 
appreciation for the flowers, 
cards, prayers and the visits 
during my stay at the 
hospital and at home. Also 
for the delicious food 
brought to our home.

Sincerely, 
Bill Cornett

TAKE AIM  TO FUTURE 
FINANCIAL SECURITYI

BANK AT HOME!
W e are interested in the welfare o f  our local 

com mu n, ty and more responsive to locul and 

individual needs than any out oftown financial 

____________ institution could ever be!

Handling the 

financial needs 

o f Groom

fo r  over bOyears

Emmett Poynor, CCU, 
High Plains, Amarillo. He is 
Pat Ashford and Connie 
Stephenson’s brother.

Edna Copeland, Room 316 
Pampa. She is undergoing 
therapy and improving.

Mary Ann Britten, Room 
840, High Plains, Amarillo

The following are recu­
perating at Home: 
Donna Burger, Mel Prather, 
Jim Babcock, Bob Corbin, 
Nancy Blackwell, Tracy 
Britten. Bill Cornett, Max 
Wade, Dolores Prather, and 
Dennis Cockrell.

GROOM BIRTHDAYS 
AND ANNIVERSARIES

September 8-Mrs. A. J. 
Babcock, Mr. and Mrs. L.A. 
Hudson

September 9-Mrs. Bill 
Hammers, Mrs. Gary W. 
Friemel, Garrett Arthur 
Britten.

September 10-Leonard
Koetting, Daniel Lambert, 
Cody Ray Schaffer, Peggy 
Cave

September 11-Mrs. Don 
Case, Mrs. Dale Brooks, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wallace L. Bichsel 

September 12-Mrs. Gary 
Don Davis

September 13-Mrs. R. L. 
Newton, T. Dwain Weller 

September 14-Faith 
Pauline Loo ten

weighing 8 lbs.

NEW ARRIVAL

Grandparents Arnold and 
Doris Kuehler of Groom and 
Marion and Sylvia Landres 
of Nowata, Okla. are pleased 
to announce the arrival of a 
baby grandson.

Travis Layne. born Sept. 
2. 1990, in Bartlesville, 
Okla. weighed 7 lbs. and 3 
ozs. Proud parents are Kent 
and Cindy Kuehler o f 
Nowata, Okla. Welcoming 
baby Travis home are 
brothers Bryan, age 7; 
Colby; age 2; and sister 
Jaymie, age 4.

Happy

Birthday, Dad

From  a young 1st

grader to an

old 1st grader!

Im m un ization  c lin ics  
offering vaccines that give 
protection against several 
childhood diseases are 
scheduled for September. 
Protection is against Polio, 
Diphtheria, Lock Jaw 
(Tetanus), Whooping Cough 
(P e r t u s s is ) ,  M e a s le s ,  
Rubella and mumps.

The Texas Department of 
Health is charging money to 
help with the cost of keeping 
the clinic open. The amount 
of money charged will be 
based on family income anu 
size, and the ability to pay.

T.D.H. will be at the 
Groom Area Clinic on Sept. 
11th from 4:00 to 7:00 p.m.

RQNl A G  & G R A IN , IN C

Serving The Farm er’s 

N eeds First!

Herbicides and 

Custom Application

Full Line O f Chemicals

A G  e G R A IN . IN C

248-7551
248-7575



THANK YOU

I wish to express my dee j 
and sincere appreciation t j  
all my friends that gave sj 
much help and comfort t j  
me during the passing of m r 
dear wife, Octie.

A.O. Denningto i

THANK YOU

Thanks to my family, 
relatives and friends for the 
visits, cards, prayers, 
flowers and phone calls 
during my stay in the 
hospital.

Alice Britten

The Land Bank.

Farmer ow nec. 
Farmer directed. 

Farm credit 
specialists.

LAND BANK

B u  7785
Amain « ,  TX 79114 

3! 3-6688

Bill & Sam's Garage
To Servo Your Automotive Needs!

24 Hour Towing

404 E. F ron t Groom  248-7335 

John Wagner 248-7940, nights

Good Luck G  room & M cLean

Tigers
BoB Cloments, Inc.

Fine Tailoring, Dry C leaning, Custom Windows 
1437 N. Hobart 665-5121

A member of th• International Fabricate Institute, 
the association 4 professional dry cleaners and launderers

Grand Opening
Bill& Sam's BarB  

Tuesday, September 4

Book your 

Seed Wheat Now!

We have several 
varieties available.

Contact M ike or Bob.

We appreciate the 

opportunit y to serve you.

ATTEBURT GRAIN, Inc.

248-7591 Groom, Texas
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Carson County Tax Rate Set 
By Court In Monday Session

Collector in the ow cin oer o,

Water
Dwight Brandt and Delk 
Watson, Engineers; Dwain 
Lane, contractor; John 
Sessions, Panhandle Plan­
ning Commission; Norris 
Hoyt, Producers Utilities; 
Don Case, Groom Water 
Department; and represen­
tatives from G.T.E.

NIGHTOC GALS NOTES

Nightin ’ Gals met 
Tuesday, August 28th with 
Thelma Pool and Shirley 
Lamberson as hostesses. 
Other members attending 
were Pearl Banks, Nettie 
Fields, Theresa W ills, 
Wynona Koetting, Barney 
Davis, Mary Britten, Sybil 
Brown, Evelyn Hubbart and 
Delores Prather. Guest for 
the evening was La Vest a 
Barnett.

Early in the evening each 
person received a present 
which remained unopened 
and could be exchanged 
until the close of the games. 
Also, Mary Britten won the 
door prize for low score. 
Evelyn Hubbart had high 
score.

Political
Calendar

The Groom News is 
authorized to present the 
names o f the following 
candidates for office, subject 
to the General Election on 
November 6, 1990. A fee of 
$35 has been paid by each 
candidate for listing in this 
column from now through 
th e  e le c t io n ,

DEMOCRAT

For Canon County Judge: 
•Jay R. Roselius 

For Canon Co. Trenanreri 
•Peggy Butler 

For Canon Co. Treasurer: 
•Peggy Butler 

For Tax Assessor-Collector: 
Donita Herbef

REPUBLICAN 
For U.S. Rep., Dtat. 13*
Dick Waterfield
•Denotes-Incumbent

WRITE-IN
For lax  Asaeaaor-CoHector:
•Rosalyn Watson

Carson County’s 1990 tax 
rate was increased 1.03 
percent by County Commis­
sioners in their regular 
session Monday, August 27. 
The current rate of .3017 
was raised to .3059 per $100 
valuation. The new rate 
breaks down thusly: . 2205 for 
general fund, .0340 for 
lateral road fund, and .0514 
for special road fund.

Also receiving unanimous 
approval by the Court, with 
Commissioner Smith absent, 
was the proposed budget. 
During a public hearing 
prior to the proposed budget 
approval. Judge Jay R. 
Roselius said that the 
budget would allocate 
operating expenses of 
$81,249 for Precinct 1 
(Groom area), $87,106 for 
Precinct 2 (South Pan­
handle, south and west to 
the county line), $93,699 for 
Precinct 3 (North 
Panhandle,' north and west 
to the county line), and 
$53,117 for Precinct 4 
(White Deer-Skellytown 
area). It was also explained 
that some monies would be 
taken from reserve funds to 
keep the tax rate lower and 
still provide the needed

resources while maintaining 
a safe reserve.

Roselius also reported 
that a verbal agreement had 
been made with Dr. Vezsey 
o f Amarillo Pathological 
Associates to do the 
County’s autopsies.

A letter concerning small 
landfills was read from 
Upton County Judge Peggy 
Garner. She said that 
unofficial information from 
Washington,D.C. indicates 
that there might be some 
flexibility for areas of the 
state that receive less than 
25 inches of precipitation 
annually and for which no 
practical alternative waste 
management facility exists. 
Small landfills serve 
communities of less than 
5,000 people and receive 
less than 10 tons of fill per 
day. The Court had pre­
viously joined other small 
counties in the area in an 
appeal to the government to 
allow some flexibility in 
proposed rules governing 
landfills.

A letter from Roslyn 
Watson was also read, in 
which she stated she would 
be running as a write-in 
candidate for Tax Assessor-

1990 General Election.
Employment applications 

for the Groom Branch 
Librarian position were 
discussed, noting that nine 
applicants sought the job 
and that it was a difficult 
decision to determine who 
would be appointed to fill 
the position vacated by 
recent retirement of Bertha 
Knight. Evelyn Hubbart, 
who has been serving a 
substitute librarian at 
Groom, was approved for 
the appointment.

In other action, the Court 
approved advertising for 
Health Insurance bids. 

'Carson County is currently 
covered by Prudential 
Insurance Com panies, 
written through the Texas 
Association of counties.

Other announcements 
were that commodities 
would again be distributed 
in October and that Labor 
Day, Sept. 3, would be a 
holiday for all County 
employees.

The next regularly 
scheduled Court meeting 
will be at 10 a.m. 
September 10.

N O W  O P E N ...
Dr. Jack Albracht wishes to announce the 

opening of his new business

ALBRACHT
CHIROPRACTIC OF PANIPA

2216 N . Coffee

F or M ore  Information o r Appointment Call353-9151

BIG BURGER SALE!
BELTBUSTER"lbe biggest of the big, with two 
Vi pound1 pure beef homestyle patties!
Only at Dairy Queen!

$L99
SALE PRICE

HUNGR-BUSTER /R* Bigger than most 
regular burgers, with a V* pound1 all-beef patty 

and your favorite 
trimmings. 

All for under 
a buck!

THIS IS

COUNTRY

SALE PRICE

L29

HUNGR-BUSTER*
Big burger, big taste! You get 
a Vi pound1100% beef patty,

served with fresh lettuce,
tomatoes, pickles, and onions.

Delicious!

| SALE 
PRICE

u  S Pat & Tm Ofl T M .  Op Coun. • Res U.S. Pat & .. _  . „
V ^ o n  / vT o  Q. corp- tPT»-oo<*°d -fe. D O. Op. Coun Good only at pafUopatmg Pary Queon

Prices Good Sept 3-Sept 23,1990



Groom D P S Report By Gary Davis

THE TIGER T, OJtS

This years Tigei spirit is 
Shannon Fields. SI e will be 
giving us words of idvice on 
how we can offer s ipport to 
our teams througl football 
season and later in basket* 
ball season.

This week the Ti ;er says.
. . "W ear Red and Black on 
Friday! Go to the P -p Rally, 
don’t just sit bi ck and 
watch... PARTICIPATE! If 
you don’t know t ie  yells, 
just clap to the bei t. Wish 
the boys "Good Luck!”  
before and after "Good 
Job!”  And when tie  Tiger, 
Talks... LISTEN!

Pep Rally-3:20 p.n.
G am e t im e -F r id a y ,  

7:00 p.m.

THANK YOC

Special thanks to Helen 
Witt for the lovinj > and 
caring poem “ Brett”  that 
the wrote in his memory. 
Also, my deep tppre iation 
to one and all for youi calls, 
kind words and prayei s.

Lucille Case and I amily

Football
tively young team. Robert is 
really impressed with what 
he has seen in younger 
members. “ There is really 
some talent there that just 
needs developing and some 
experience.”  Robert plays 
tail back and middle line­
backer.

lunior Brian Baker is also 
looking for a great season. 
His explanation of “ TCB”  
“ ...doing whatever you have 
to-to win!”  Playing several

positions, like quarterback, 
running back and safety 
have helped Brian to become 
a stronger team member, 
explaining that this helps 
everyone to be comfortable 
with more than one job. 
Baker felt that this years 
toughest opponents would 
be Higgins or McLean.

Coach Jimmy Branch 
reports that both teams did 
well in last weeks 
scrimmages. Tiger Varsity 
scored 9 times, even though 
two T.D.’s were called back. 
Junior Varsity scored an out­
standing 14 times.

On 8-29-90, Trooper Gary 
Davis was called to investi­
gate a car-sheep accident in 
Groom. The driver of the 
1979 Buick, Carlene Britten 
of Groom, struck 2 head of 
sheep on Front Street. Miss 
Britten was not injuried but 
the sheep didn’t make it.

On 8-30-90 at 10:15 p.m., 
Trooper Gary Davis of 
Groom, stopped a 1983 Olds- 
mobile driven by James 
Cassidy of Euclid, Ohio for

traffic violations. Several 
baggies of marijuana were 
seized and Cassidy arrested 
for possession of Marijuana. 
Cassidy was booked into jail 
at Panhandle and the next 
day paid a fine of $634.50.

On 9-1-90, Trooper Gary 
Davis arrested a John 
Wagner of Groom for DWI.

Mr. Wagner was placed in 
jail and charged with DWI.

The Amarillo DPS office 
reports the final motorcide 
death count at 33. This is 
well below the expected 40 
they had estimated. Of these 
26 occurred at night, 17 were 
not wearing seat belts, and 
at press time 16 deaths were 
alcohol related. Only one 
death occurred in the Texas 
Panhandle near Hereford.

GHS Cheer Leaders ’90-Marie Conrad, Shannon Fields, Katonia Meeker. 
Lesa Sweatt, Sharoiyn Chandler and Krista Burgin - T.C.B. when it comes 
to cheetsl

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Groom

Flying Service 

Craig Howard

A ll Types o f aerial applications 
★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★  ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ • *  

Good Service-Reasonable Prices

Harris & Office Craig

248-7561 248-7420

Good Luck
A

Groom Tigers

Beat Alamo Catholic
9

Here - 7:00 p.m. - 7

Bill & Sam's Enterprises 

Wieberg Welding
a

Attebury Grain, Inc. We are behind you, Tigers Pay's Service Station

Blackwell Supply 

Brumley Insurance

Bivens' Automotive 

Keith Barkley Auto Repair

Jim & Donna Burton 

RGM Ag & Grain, Inc.

Circle B Meat Co. 

The Groom News

Stop-N-Shop Once Upon 4 Time 

Tina's Hair Care-A-Sel
Dairy Queen

Groom Flying Service Wheeler Evans Elevators Co.



School
Parking Hazard

Back to school means an 
added traffic hazard for 
drivers. Not only is thtre a 
need to watch out for little 
pedestrians but bicycle» can 
also prove difficult to see.

One area that is espe daily 
troublesome is the school 
parking lot. A few year i ago 
a concerned group of 
parents along with the help 
of P.T.O. designed a pa rkitjg 
method to ensure the • afety 
of children who exit 0 1  the 
east end of the school.' Tiese 
youngsters are mainly 
elementary age and there­
fore are harder to spot. They

are always in a hurry to get 
home, and do not watch for 
traffic as well as they 
should. Mott teachers have 
trained them to walk in the 
cross walk area that have 
been marked off for this 
purpose. When cars drive 
through this area, the 
children are not expecting to 
dodge traffic.

The diagram will explain 
where to park. Parents are 
urged to explain and 
encourage spouses, grand­
parents and student drivers 
to study the diagram to 
ensure the safety of the 
students.

Services Held
Brett Allen, age 17, 

passed away August 27, 
1990 as a result of chronic 
respiratory disease due to 
cerebral palsy which he had 
since birth. Survived by 
parents, Don and Emma 
Kay Sargent; sisters, Angela 
and Stacey Sargent; all of 
DeSoto; grandmothers, Mrs. 
Lucille Case, of Groom. TX.,

G y  in
fibr A 7>r/Mc Tngtx | Vo to n g

V"" \ \ \  ̂ V
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Sept. 10-Moe.iBrei kfast 
Cereal, blueberry muffins, 
juice and milk

Lunch-Corn dogs, pxk & 
beans, onion rings, pickle 
spears, bread, butter, ■ hoco- 
late cake

Sept. 11, Tue.:Bre (kfast- 
Pancakes, peanut 1 
syrup, juice, milk 

Lunch-Meat 3c c 
enchiladas, pinto leans, 
salad, picante sauce, chips, 
milk, pineapple tidbit - 

Sept. 12, Wed-tBre Jrfast- 
Scrambled egge. hash 
browns, toast, juice, i (ilk 

Lunch-Turkey, m odles.

Mrs. Pearl Sargent of Can­
yon. TX.; and a boat of other 
relatives and friends. 
Services were at 3:30 p.m., 
Wednesday, at the Laurel 
Land Funeral Home Chapel. 
Interment at Laurel Land 
Memorial Park.

The following poem was 
written by Helen Witt in 
memory of Brett. It was used 
in his funeral service.

BRCTT
An angel came down to 
earth
and dwelt for a little while 
formed as a precious little 
boy
with fair hair and beguiling 
smile.

He brought both pain and 
gladness
with his helpless loving 
ways.

and captured hearts about
him
in his life of treasured days.

Then he slipped into 
eternity.
resuming his rightful place 
to play in celestial grade ns. 
secure in God's embrace.

Helen Witt

GB DOM 1SD MENU
cheese sticks, green peas, 
buttered carrots, butter, hot 
sliced bread, milk, cherry 
cobbler

Sept. 13, Ttat-iBreakfast- 
Bacon, biscuits, gravy, 
juice, milk

Lunch-Lasagne with meat, 
cheese, fried okra, salad, 
butter, bread sticks, milk, 
banana pudding

Sept. 14, FHiBreakfast- 
Donuts, cinnamon rolls, 
juice, milk

L u n ch -R o a s t b e e f ,  
mashed potatoes, gravy, 
green beans, butter, hot 
rolls, milk, chocolate chip 
cookiesr PRINTING ’

! 148-7333
Envelopes - Cards - Invitations

U

The Groom News j

One Hour Martinizing
B ring your cleaning when you shop

in Pam pa .......

Pick it up the same day!!!!

Two locations to serve you- 

1807 N. Hobart-1824 W. Francis

ALL VARIETIES

COKES
6 PACK 12 0Z. CANS

$009

MELL0 CRISP

SLICED
BACON

1 LB. PKG.

*139
ALLSU P 'S

F A M O U S-F R ESH

BURRIT0S

WILSONS

FRAN KS
12 OZ. PKG.

S ta rK is t

T U N A
6K 0Z. CAN

79*

HAM, EGG AND

BISCUIT

Thank You For 
Shopping At Your 

Nearby Allsup Store. 

Com e By and See Us.

Open ? 4  Hours
____  Everyday/

-  g r o o m  -
Prices effective Sept. 9 -15

While Supplies Last.

ALLSUP'S

BREAD
V/i LB. LOAF

A LLSUP'S
I___________  - — I
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bATHER N E 'TR  
HONORED

Immaculate Heai t of Mary

Catholic Church hosted a 
c e le b r a t io n  h o n o r in g  
Richard J. Neyer’s thirty 
years in the priesthood. A 
celebrated mass began at 
6:30 p.m. with 17 priests and 
18 nuns from the area

attending. Bishop Leroy T. 
Mathieson gave the 
message. A reception and 
dinner was held at the hall 
immediately following the 
mass. Lots of food and 
fellowship were enjoyed by

Ward Palmer's

MUSTANG ARENA
CLAUDE

$40 Round Robin 
Saturday, September 8

Call226-2410 to pre-enter

Hooks Open 5:00 Rope at 7:00

j' rophy buckles to top
WC

header and heeler
Limit 20 x 20

Over$l 300 paid out in 2 weeks 0

parishioners and former 
parishioners of Father Neyer 
with approximately 160 in 
attendance.

Father Neyer wishes to 
thank all of the people of the 
parish and the community 
for their kindness and 
respect to the parish and for 
the priesthood.

Local Happenings

Last Wednesday, William 
and Floretta Neal o f ' 
Amarillo, A.D. &. Ethel Neal 
Nellie Ford A  Bertha Knight 
went to Clarendon to help 
their brother, Leslie Neal, to 
celebrate his 83rd birthday. 
Others enjoying the bounti­
ful picnic lunch spread on 
tables under the large trees 
in the back year were: 
Leslie’s wife, Dora; son 
Harold of Pauls Valley, 
Okla.; the Neal’ s close 
neighbors, Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Hunter, Mrs. Alyce Muden 
and Mrs. Edna Johnson.

The Friends of the Library 
will be sponsoring a used 
book sale in the month of 
October. All proceeds from 
the sale go to fund library 
projects.

Anyone having used 
books to donate to the sale 
may bring them by the 
library or to have your books 
picked up call Adela Kotara 
248-7585 or Marion Pool 
248-7286.

ESTATE

Adah  Wooten Estate located at 422 E. 2nd, Shamrock, Texas. 

Saturday, September 8,1990 10:00 a.m.
REAL ESTATE

REAL ESTATE TO BE SOLD AT 12:00 p.m.,2 BR. Living, Dining, Dan, Braakfait araa. Kitchen, 

Offlc i, Stucca bente, separata garage. Inspectlen marnlng at September 0 ar any time by 

appelntmant. Sellar has 30 minutes ta aecept ar reject final bid.
FURNITURE

1- Bedroom suite-double 
bad, dresser, cheat of 
drawers
2- matching shgle beds, 
dresser, chest c>f drawers
1-double bed
1 -K e n m o ro  - s e w in g  
machine, cabin it type 
1-dlnlng room sjite, double 
drop leaf . and 4 needle 
point cover chairs and 
matching butte 
1-recllner 
1-day bed 
1-desk and chair
1- mauve coach ind chair
2- green wlngba:k chairs 
1-coffee table
1-stereo tape player 
1 -window type efrigerated 
airconditioner 
1 -evaporated aii conditioner 
1-gas range 
1-Frigidair refrijerator

Irene Barth 

256-2787 

Shamrock. Tx.

CALL:

OR
James Hefley 

779-3134 

McLean, Tx.

1-double drop leaf table 
and chairs
1- armchair
2- TV stands
1- Eureka car vacuum
2- card tables and chairs 

Dishes and Appliances
Nice crystal-pitcher, water 
glasses, sherberts, tea 
glasses, plates, etc.
Hand painted cups and 
plates (matching) 
1-Rosenfeldt pottery bowl 
1-wood salad set 
1-coffee maker

FROM THE M AU R ITA  BU M PERS  ESTATE: 

Bedroom suite, coach, chairs, and many various Items.

1-waffle Iron 
1-vacuum cleaner 
1-large fan 
1-toaster oven 
1-blender 
1-Presto cooker 
l-large lot of dishes (many 
old), cooking utensils, and 
various kitchen appliances 
4-pieces of luggage

Many Items tee numerous 
to mention

Antiques and Collectables

1-0Id Kodak camera 
1-Kodak Baby Brownie 
Special
1-tennis racket (65 yrs. old) 

_1 -set old binoculars and 
leather case 
1-old 32 cal. pistol 
1-lot old books-

JA M E S  HEFLEY
84 2

We act as agents only. 
Terms of Sale: CASH 

Note: Please Bring Your Own 
Check Book

Not Responsible For accidents

*
H e

Ttm
Sound that

y *

Auction Co.
MORE ITEM S 

EXPECTED SALE DAY
Lunch will be available 
Winch truck available on sale day

TRI-STATE FAIR 
SEPTEMBER 17-22

The Coliseum entertain­
ment will take on a different 
look at the 1990 Amarillo Tri 
State Fair, scheduled for 
September 17-22. Rather 
than musical concerts alone 
each evening, several shows 
involving other acts of enter­
tainment will be featured. 
Music, however, will be the 
order of the night for 
Thursday, September 20tA 
when the big Khiva Shrine 
Stage Band and the Khiva 
Western Swing Band will 
perform. The Khiva Stage 
Band will have center stage 
from 6:30 p.m. until 8:00 
p.m. and the Shrine 
Western Swing Band will 
perform from 9:00 p.m. until 
closing. The Stage Band 
features a full stage band 
instrumentation o f four 
trumpets, four trombones, 
five saxes, drums, piano, 
bass guitar and tuba. The 
Swing Band was organized 
in 1988 and features five top 
musicians, some of whom 
have played with such bands1

as Bob Wills. Fair-goers 
may want to just sit and 
enjoy or to dance to the 
music.

Friday night, September 
21st, w ill feature Gary 
Roberts performing his 
magical acts at 6:30 p.m. 
and 7:45 p.m. and then 
listening or dancing to the 
music of the Rowdy Ace 
Band from 9:00 p.m. until 
closing. Roberts has been a 
featured performer at fairs, 
shopping malls, night clubs 
and on television all over the 
United States and Canada. 
Be prepared for a bit of 
magic, a lot of surprises, and 
a lot of fun at the Gary 
Robert Show.

Visiting Evelyn Hubbart 
over Labor Day weekend 
was sister Juanita Brock 
from Dallas and from 
Tucson, Ariz., her brother 
and his wife, Gordon and 
Lucille Utsler. They visited 
their mother, Edna Russell 
at St. Anne’s in Panhandle. 
They spent Monday touring 
Palo Duro Canyon and the 
Museum.

Britten Family Gathers
The Marietta Britten clan 

gathered August 26 to 
c o m m em o ra te  v a r io u s  
family celebrations. The 
festivities were held in the 
home of Mariellen and Jeny 
Homfeld of Adrian. Among 
the family members honored 
for August birthdays 
included: Terrell and Becky 
Britten, Rebecca West, 
Marva Bichsel, Kristy 
Homfeld and Marietta 
Britten, who turned 781 
Becky Britten was also 
honored for recently obtain­
ing her Bachelor of Science 
Degree from West Texas 
State University. Other 
celebrations included the 
engagement o f Marva 
Bichsel to Mr.Bob Fries.

A delicious meal of ham­
burgers and all the trim­
mings was enjoyed by all. 
Ice cream and special

decorated cakes were served 
for dessert. Games and gab 
took place much of the 
afternoon.

Among those who were in 
attendance from Groom 
include: Marietta Britten; 
Bill and Georgann Hinson. 
David and Daniel; Lynn and 
Sue Britten, Leo, Kay Lynn 
and Cody; Charles Britten; 
and Terrell and Becky 
Britten.

Others in attendance 
were: Bryan and Cindy
Bichsel. CallLe and Dee of 
Claude; Rebecca West o f 
Canyon; Jett and Lynette 
Major, Carey and Casey of 
Littlefield; Marva Bichael of 
Amarillo; Bob Fries of 
Lubbock; Tom and Sandra 
Sweat and daughter of 
Amarillo; and Jerry and 
Mariellen Homfeld, Kristy 
and Roy of Adrian.

C & H Supply, Inc.
McLean, Texas 779-2209

Checkout Our Price Reduced 

Summer Products And Just 

Received Fall & Winter Supplies

M e  Lean 

Video Quest

114M. Mam Street 779-2311

Tape and VCR Rental

2/$3°° $5°°
Open Mon.-Sat. 12 -8:00 p.m.

^  f t * *
Sound that

>  S A - ctf-

A u c tio n  Co.

McLean. Tx. 790)7  Box 42
(806)779 )154



o

Lovett Librar'.
Box B,
M cL ean r^rx . 7 9 0 5 7

Phillips 66 Station To Be 

Restored To Boom Days
Tearing down an old gas 

station is not much cause for 
celebration these days, but 
restoring one to its former 
glory is what is bringing the 
community o f McLean 
together on Saturday, 
September 8th.

A tiny brick Phillips 66 
station that has stood empty 
and deteriorating for 5 
decades will be restored on 
Saturday to a state reminis­
cent of the days when it 
served customers that 
traveled on Old Route 66.

Workers will begin the 
transformation o f the “ little 
station." as the building has 
come to be known, begin­
ning about 9 a.m. Saturday 
morning.

From re-roofing and 
painting to refurbishing a 
donated grease rack, the 
one-day restoration project 
will involve people of all 
ages from the community.

Though anyone pulling 
into McLean’s restored 
Phillips 66 station will have
Vo « « t t k  fo r a photograph
rather than a "fill-up," it is 
anticipated that the little 
station will see a lot of

visitors. An instance land­
mark in McLean where the 
move to create interest in 
"O ld Route 66”  brings the 
promise of greater visitor 
traffic and commerce to the 
small 1-40 community.

In fact part of the urgency 
in seeing that the work gets 
done on Sept. 8th is due to 
the fact that the station will 
be one of five McLean 
Check-points for hundreds 
of vehicles participating in 
the Elk City, Okla. Run 
which will take place the 
following Sat, Sept 15th.

The restoration of the 
“ 66" Station is just the 
beginning for McLean’ s 
involvement in the “ Old 
Route 66“  revival. A room is 
being set aside for a 
historic display of “ Old 
Route 66“  items in the 
National Barbed Wire Assn. 
Museum slated to open in 
McLean in early 1991 in the 
old Marie Foundation 
factory building. Location of 
the “ Old 66 Phillips 
Station is "O ld Route 66" 
and Gray St. in downtown 
McLean.

The McLean Tigers 1990 
season kicks off Friday night 
when the state’s fifth ranked 
McLean Tigers travels to 
lazbuddie to meet the 
leventh ranked team.

Coach Miller said that the 
Cigers scrimmaged Miami 
Rat Friday night and looked

__
Perennial playoff con ten- 

ler Christoval is the 
inanimous choice as the No. 
1 team in the season’s first 
six-man high school football 
poll, which is conducted by 
the Lubbock Avalanche- 
Journal.

1990 M d E A N

T I G E R S

Se p t. 7 L a z b u d d ii T

Sep t. 14 F o l le t t H

Sept. 21 S llve rto n H

Sep t. 28 H arro ld T

O ct. 5 V a lle y T

O ct. 12 * L e fo r s  *** H

O c t. 19 * G r o o m T

O c t. 26 • M iam i H

N ov. 2 * Fo lle tt T

Nov. 9 * H ig g in s H

Oistrlct Garnet *
Homecoming » •

1990

NOTES & TALES
From

OLD ROUTE 66
by D. Trew

Anyone who has lived on 
the plains knows all about 
black mud, red mud, and 
plain old sticky mud. In 
between the sandy stretches 
of Old 66, and in between a 
few gravel hills lay dirt, and 
in fact, it was the stickiest, 
gooeyist, gummyist, stuff 
imagineable.

Venice Wright of McLean, 
tells of the old days when 
she lived near Shamrock. 
Her father, brothers and 
neighbors all made side 
money, using their teams to 
pull the tourists through a 
stretch of mud near their 
home.

Several Groom farmers 
and Ernest Foshece, who 
lived at Jericho tell of the 
terrible mud at Jericho Gap. 
People would weave tow 
chains through the spokes of 
their car wheels to get 
traction but when Jericho 
Gap’s mud was just right, it 
would just ball up to the 
fenders and you would stall, 
get out, dig it out and try

Yellow Ribbon Campaign 

f  Remembers Local Boys

Rush Turner of McLean, 
recalls of a time when he 
was just a pup. (1920’s), 
and lived east of Alanreed 
when the old road (before 
66), ran south of the rail­
road. A Greyhound bus, 
carrying about 12 people, 
slipped into the ditch, about 
straight north o f Frank 
Worsham’s house now. His 
father and brothers had to 
get three teams to pull it out 
and then had to pull it to 
start it.Rush rode on the bus
to Alanreed, where the 
driver signed a “ chit,”  
getting five dollars from tile 
bus station and paid Rush. 
He then walked home 
somewhat better off. It was a 
thrill just to get to ride the 
bus, he said.

Call me about your 
stories, as 1 am about to run 
out.

McLean Tigers Kicks 

OffSeason in Lazbuddie
It’s Your Right...

Christoval, which 
has woo a state title, returns 
19 lettennen from a team 
that went 12-1 last season 
and reached the state semi­
finals.

All seven sports writers 
participating in the poll 
voted the Cougars No. 1.

Although Fort Hancock 
has only one starter back 
from the 1989 state 
championship team, the 
Mustangs edged Guthrie for 
the No. 2 spot in the poll. 
Fort Hancock has won the 
past two state crowns and 
three of the last four.

It’ s simple, convenient 
and important.

The United States is one 
of the few countries in the 
world where free elections 
are routinely taken for 
granted. Voting is ooe of the 
moat important rights and 
privileges o f American 
citizenship. Unfortunately, 
many take that right and 
privilege for granted and fail 
to vote. That is a shame 
because it means that noo- 
voters allow other to make 
the decisions that affect all 
of us. Millions of Texans 
who are otherwise eligible to 
vote aren’t even registered, 
and registration is so easy.

In the past, the voter 
registration system itself 
was blamed for low registra­
tion rates. In addition, such 
obstacles as literacy tests, 
poll taxes, requirements that 
a voter be a land-owner, and 
many other barriers served 
to discourage or prohibit 
registration.

Today however, voter 
registration couldn’ t be 
easier or more convenient. 
You may register in person 
or simply fill out and mail in 
a postcard application. My 
office has distributed more 
than 16 million voter regis­
tration postcard applica­
tions -  an average of one for 
every eligible Texan - - 
through the cooperation of 
local businesses, schools, 
libraries and volunteer 
organizations. If you cannot 
find applications locally, call

toll-free 1-800-252-VOTE 
(8683) and ask my staff to 
send you a registration 
application. It takes just a 
few minutes to fill it out, 
sign it and mail it back or 
deliver it in person to the 
voter registrar, or a deputy 
voter registrar in your 
county. If you mail your 
application, the postage is 
even paid.

Let’s look at the regis­
tration process in a bit more 
detail.

Who it eligible to register 
to vote? Anyone may 
register to vote who is: (1) a 
U.S. dtizen;(2) 17 yean and 
10 months of age or older on 
the date the registration is 
submitted to the county 
voter registrar;(3) a resident 
of the county in which 
application for registration is 
m sde;(4) has not been 
d e te rm in e d  m en ta lly  
incompetent by a final 
judgment of a court, and (5) 
has not been finally convict­
ed of a felony from which the 
registrant has not been 
psrdoned or otherwise 
released from the resulting 
disability to vote.

How do you register to 
vote? As I mentioned, you 
simply complete a registra­
tion application which asks 
your name, sex, residence 
address, date of birth and 
birthplace. If you are a 
naturalized citizen, you must 
also provide the location of 
the court of naturalization.

See Vote, Pg. 8

McLean’s yellow ribbon 
campaign has attracted lots 
of attention the past week. 
McLean has six young men 
in the Mideast at this time 
We want these boys to know 
that we are behind them at 
all times with our thoughts 
and prayers: Carey Don 
Smith, son of Mr. and MRs. 
Carey Don Smith, is on the 
USS Okinawa;Kevin D. 
McDowell, son of Mollyt 
McDowell and Bob

MCLEAN DULL TEAM

(Editor’ s Note: We at the 
M cL ea n -G ro o m  N ew s 
humbly apologize for the 
mess we made of your story 
and Card of Thanks.)

The McLean Drill Team 
would like to express their 
appreciation for the wonder­
ful job our local ban, 
“ Southern Star”  did at the 
dance Saturday night at the 
Gerald Tate Ag Bam. It was 
a fund raiser for the drill 
team and an opportunity for 
all of us to hear the band. 
They are superior.

Thank you, 
"T iger Mania”  

McLean Drill Team

Rev. Walter Lee 

Comstock Services 

Held In Lamesa

Rev. Walter Lee Com­
stock, 87, died Wednesday, 
Ang. 29, 1990, In Lameaa.

Services were at 11 a.m. 
Saturday in Pentecostal 
Holiness Church with the 
Rev. Joseph Lucas, pastor of 
Foursquare Gospel Church 
of Lamesa, officiated. Burial 
was in Hilkrest Cemetery by 
Lamb Funeral Home.

Rev. Comstock, born in 
Putnam County, moved to 
McLean in 1964 from 
Garfield. N.M. He moved to 
Lamesa in 1968. He married 
Gladys Dougherty in 1928 at 
El Reno, Okla. She died in 
1986. He had been a 
minister o f Pentecostal 
Holiness Church for 55 
years, where he was also a 
member.

Survivors include four 
daughters, Fran Manning 
of Fritch, Myrtle Lucas of 
Lamesa, Thelma Destarac of 
Thornton, Colo, and Trixh 
Gross of Psmpa; two sons. 
Gordon Comstock of 
Hamilton, Ohio and the Rev. 
William Comstock of Hobbs, 
N .M .; a brother, Roy 
Comstock o f Oceanside, 
Calif.; 28 grandchildren; and 
31 great-grandchildren.

McDowell is aboard the 
USNS Truckee Tanker; Stacy 
Jackson, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Wm. D. Jackson, la 
aboard the USS Iwo Jima; 
Staff Sgt. Darin Corley is in 
a tank command; Billy Ray 
Corley with the 101st Air- 
born; and, Tracy Gordon 
with a Troop Headquarters 
out of Fort Bliss. Perhaps 
there are other service 
personnel that have been 
misted, if so please call and 
let us know.

New Arrival
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Glenn 

Gipson of Ennis, Texas 
announced the arrival of a 
baby girl, Amy Machille, 
August 30th. She weighed 6 
lbs. 1 ox., 18 inches long. 
She has a big brother Mark 
who it 3.

Proud grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Gipson, McLean; Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Marion of Ennis; 
Mr. and Mrs. Grant Garrett 
of Childress. Great-grand­
parents are Mr. Bill Kelly of 
Childreaa;Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Marion o f Goodwill, 
Okla.; and Mae Gipson of 
Plainview.

REMNDER!
McLEAN COMMUNITY 

CALENDAR

Fm M  game. Friday. 
September 7 at Lazbuddie.

1 k m  w l  be a birthday 
card shower for Kate Jooea, 
Monday, September 10th at 
420 - 4th St, Clarendon,

Pi 79226. She win be 95 
old.

MCLEAN BD  MENU

Sap*. 6, Thara.-Grilled 
cheese, pickles, french fries, 
carrot sticks, fruit, milk 

Sept 7, Fri.-Steak Fingers 
creamed gravy, mashed 
potatoes, green beans, hot 
rolls A  butter, honey A  milk 

Sept. 19, Men.-Sloppy 
Joe’s, pickles, french fries, 
pork A  beans, rice K-Bars, 
Milk

Sept. 11-Wed.-Taco’ s 
w/meat A  cheese, salad, 
ranch style beans, cake, milk 

Sept. 13, Tkmm.-Ham- 
burgers, lettuce A  tomatoes, 
onions A  pickles, french 
fries, fruit, milk

Sept. 14, Frl.-Chicken 
fried steak, cream gravy, 
mashed potatoes, tossed 
% lad, W W hot rolls, butter- 
jhoney, milk



*  We Are A ll Behind You!
J  S m  3son Insurance Agency

*  Jasper Roofing C  & H Supply, Inc

$  Meteor Pharmacy
*
a

§  Bank O f Commerce 
*
5  James lief ley Auction Co 
♦
J  Countr/ Corner Texaco * Alberta's Beauty Shop

♦
J  Richart son Texaco Hambright Building Supplies

*
McLean Hardware Taylor Food Mart Magee Ranch

Johnnie & Colleen 

Mertel Boot ShopCorinne's Style Shop

Cl Paso Natural Gas Co B & B  Electric

Puckett's GroceryLamb Flower Shop

The McLean News

B & B  Turbine

>« OMW Judg«b MK 1VW, n » » i ,
f  y  y  y y  y  y  •Denotes Incumbent
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"  Good Luck 1
McLean Tigers

Lazbuddie
^  There - September 7,1990

Gray County Trauaurer
Elaine Cooper
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Alanreid News
Dan Martin made a trip to 

Altus, Okla. Saturday.

Visiting N< 11 Reese and 
boys were 1 er sons and 
grandsons fro n Fort Worth. 
She returnee home with 
them for a lor g visit.

Due to water problems at 
the school house the 
Community Improvement 
meeting was postponed until 
next week.

Visiting the Hartley 
Davis' Saturday was Mr. 
and Mr. J.A. Wetsel of 
Lubbock.

R.I.. Leeder made a trip to 
Shamrock Friday.

YOU RE RADIATOR DAMAGED 
Don't Throw It Away 
Check With Us First! 

Radla o r Repair la Our Business 
Wo rep air Plastic, Aluminum, Copper, 
Brass, f It can bu fixed wa can repair 
lit

Automotive & Industrial

Sonny Bryant, his son-in- 
law and grandson oA Pampa 
were here on Friday.

We are very proud of our 
new roads (through our 
cemetery) built by the 
county. It makes everything 
look real nice.

The Olin Weldon’s were 
in Borger to attend the 
funeral of Addie’ s sister. 
Our sympathies are with 
them.

McLean Briefs

Mr. and Mrs. C lyde 
Mounce o f Omaha, Neb. 
visited his mother. Mrs. Hal 
Mounce, the first o f this 

week.

JOHN S CAROLYN STOKES 
OWNERS 

S1SW. Brown 
HwySO-Pampa, TX.

6 6 5 - 0 1 9 0 1
V  NO ANSWER SCS-7SM

* * * *  * * * * * * * * * *  

*  *

^  ELEC T *

*MARVNDALE i y O  *
*  31st Judicial .
^  District Judge *

Political Calendar
The McLean News is 

authorized to present the 
names o f the following can­
didates for office, subject to 
the General Election on 
November 6, 1990. A fee of 
S35 has been paid by each, 
candidate for listing in this 
column from now through 
the election.

Keitha Clark from Pampa, 
granddaughter o f Jodie 
Thomas and great-grand­
mother Velma Cornell, 
visited Monday evening on 
her way back to Lubbock 
where she attends Texas 
Tech.

Su perin tenden t Rex 
Visiting Bertha Smith over Peeples is cut o f town this 

the Labor Day weekend were week attending a 
her daughter and family invention, 
from Pampa.

Vote
The application also 
contains a statement that 
you are a U.S. citizen, a 
statement that you are a 
resident of the couoty, a 
statement that you have not 
been finally convicted of a 
felony or. if convicted, have 
been pardoned or otherwise 
released from the resulting 
disability to vote, and infor­
mation about where you’ve 
previously registered to vote 
(in order to keep the voter 
rolls current). You sign the 
card.indicating that all those 
facts shown are true, date it, 
and return it to the registrar 
of voters in your county.

223rd Judicial District 
Court Judge
Lee Waters

Jasdce of the Peace 
Gray County No. 4 

•R. C. Parker

District Judge of Mat 
Judicial District

M. Kent Sims 
Jean A, Martindale 
Gray County deck 

Wanda Cartel

Gray County Judge
Jim Osborne

Our Medicare Supplement Insurance 
is among the best...

te, good price and 
good neighbor claim service

Ask About Health 
The State Farm Way

GLEN COURTNEY
2100  Perryton Parkw ay, Pam pa, Texas

PHONE: 685-4051 or 1-800-658-6303
Like a good neighbor, State Farm is there.

State Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company 
Home Office: Bloomington, Illinois
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The number of people 
who are heating and 
cooling their homes and 
businesses with the Dual 
Fuel Heat Pump continues 
to grow. In the past five 
years, sales have increased 
nearly 800%! Folks love 
Dual Fuel Heat Pumps 
for their economy, depend­
ability and cleanliness.

Call your Dual Fuel 
Heat Pump Dealer.

M cLean Care Center News
Sunday morning the 

residents attended Sunday 
school, our helpers were 
Mary Frazier, Maebelle 
Nash. Jenny Stubbs and 
Inez Trostle. In the after­
noon Bro. Claude Peach, 
Pastor of the Pentecostal 
Church, was here to conduct 
services.

Residents working in 
crafts Monday morning were 
LiUie Knox, Imogene King, 
Teresa Richardson, Monnie 
Matthews, Leon Burch, 
Ruby Ayers. Mary Helen 
Boston. Adelle Walker and 
Lucille Cullison. In the after­
noon the following residents 
played bingo: Ruby Ayers. 
Pauline Miller, Mattie and 
Dick Wheeler. Lucy Skipper, 
Leon Burch, Lillie Knoi. 
K ittie Hessey, Teresa 
Richardson. Eula Morrow.

' Mary Sligar, Mary Helen 
Boston. Monnie Matthews. 
Clyde Trusty, John Meyers, 
Earl Tolleson, Thelma 
Hopkins and Francis 
Kennedy. Our volunteer 
helpers were Avalee

MCLEAN VOLLEYBALL 
SCHEDULE

A volleyball team has 
been organized by Coach 
Finsterwald and Kathy 
Hembree is helping her 
coach.

The follow ing is the 
volleyball schedule for 9th 
through 12th grades:

Sept. 4-Mobeetie at 
McLean
Sept. 11-McLean at Kelton 
Sept. 18-Lefors at McLean 
Sept. 25-McLean at Briscoe 
Oct 2-Open
Oct. 9-McLean at Mobettie 
Oct. 16-Kelton at McLean 
Oct. 23-McLean at Lefbrs 
Oct. 30-Briscoe at McLean 
Tournaments on Sat.. Sept 

ISth-Briscoe 
Oct. 13 or 20-Lefors

McLean Briefs

Ida Good from Wheeler 
visited Jodie Thomas Friday 
evening. Ida had been in 
Amarillo playing in a golf 
tournament at Tascosa 
Country Club where she won 
second place.

Crockett, Sylvia McClellan 
and C liffie  Heasley. 
Bananas were furnished by 
the Lions Club.

Tuesday morning the 
following residents shelled 
peas: Mary Helen Boston. 
Teresa Richardson, Imogene 
King. Francis Kennedy. 
Thelma Hopkins, Leona 
Sitter, V irgie Everette, 
Adelle Walker. Ruby King. 
Leon Burch, Mattie Wheeler 
and Annie Eudey. In the 
afternoon Lena Carter. Mary 
Davis and Brenda MacLain 
were here to assist the 
residents in dominos, those 
playing were Thelma 
Hopkins, Imogene King, 
Teresa Richardson. Leon 
Burch. Eula Morrow. Annie 
Eudey, Mary Helen Boston 
and Dick Wheeler.

Wednesday afternoon 
ladies from the Hedley 
Baptist Church were here for 
a Sing-A-Long. Laquita Cox 
played the piano and Wanda 
Fountain gave the devo­
tional, other ladies partici­
pating were Opal Clenden-

MCLEAN BIRTHDAYS 
AND ANNIVERSARIES

S e p te m b e r  8 -R oy  
McMullen, E.J. Windoni, 
Sr., Donald Bradley

September  9 -Judy 
Kennedy, Bill and Tina 
Thomas

Scptemer 10-ZeUa Mae 
Brown

September 11-Jewel 
Cousins, Lou Morris, Harris
D, Spain

September 13-Rita Barker 
September 14-David Karl

Kniffen. Jerrett Coleman

M cLean Briefs

Visiting Mary Lou and 
Dale Glass over the weekend 
were Jamie Glass from Ft. 
Worth, TX, Terry and Joe 
Luna from Waxahachie, TX 
and Sherry, Rachel and 
Sandy Kromen from Skelly- 
town. On Saturday they 
drove to Palo Duro Canyon
and on to Friona to visit 
Mary Lou’s parents, Koy 
and Eva Miller.

nen, Joyce Boliver and Floy 
Barrow.

Thursday morning the 
residents enjoyed the donuts 
furnished by Lets Mae Hess. 
In the afternoon the follow­
ing residents attended our 
current events program: 
Pauline M iller, Lucy 
Skipper, Dick and Mattie 
W heeler, Stella Gibson, 
Kittie Hessey, Eula Morrow, 
Mary Sligar, Mary Helen 
Boston, V irgie Everette, 
Teresa Richardson, Imogene 
King, Ruby King, Frank 
Howard, Onie Pershall, 
John Meyers, Leona Sitter 
and Lillie Knox. Water­
melon was served following 
the session. Many thanks to 
Burt and Norma Estes for 
furnishing the melons.

Our birthday party for the 
month of September will be 
Thursday, Sept. 13th at 2:30 
p.m. Residents having birth­
days will be Mitchell 
Frazier, Annie Eudey, 
Jewell Cousins, Lucille 
Cullison, Ruby Phillips and 
Mary Helen Boston.

6-Man Top 10 

Teams Released
Hera is the first weekly Top 10 

•mono Texas* six-man football schools, 
with point totals for each loam and first- 
place votes in parentheses (10 points for 
first. 9 for second, etc.):
1. Christoval (7) ................. ........»

EMERGENCY FEED 
PROGRAM

Carson County has been 
approved for Emergency 
Feed Programs. This 
program is designed to 
assist livestock producers 
who have suffered at least a 
40 percent feed loss because 
of drought conditions. This 
program has a $50,000 
payment limitations and 
persons with a gross income 
of over $2.5 million aren’t

eligible. Eligible producers 
may purchase grain from 
C.C.C. inventory or receive 
cost shares for other 
purchased feed.

CONSERVATION 
RESERVE PROGRAM

W e’ ve finally received 
enougfh rainfall in some 
areas to grow weeds. 
Remember, you must 
control weeds on C.R.P 
acres. We will be checking:
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C.R.P. in the next few 
weeks. Failure to have 
weeds mowed by September 
15th will result in severe 
penalties.

ACREAGE
CONSERVATION

REDUCTION

Weeds and erosion must 
be controlled on ACR & CU 
acres also.

W HEELER-EVANS

ELEVATORS
Groom & Corner North 

W e  are happy to be of service"

Phones: 248-7262 or 248-7278 

Corner 248-7011

............57
3. Guthrie...................... ............54

............3*

............30
7. Zephyr...................... ............14

» Jsn M b o ro .................... ............13
10 Mav.......... .........................11

Other teams receiving votes. Silver- 
ton 9. P anther Creek 7, New Home 6. 
Trinidad 6. Trent 5. Cherokee 3. Sands 1.

248-7350

Groom, Texas

P eo p le  
w h o  
o w n  ’em .
love 'em !

DEANS pi'iarm acy
2217 Perrvtoa Pari way

Looking forward 
to serving our 

j  room cu stomers. 
Ask about our 

mail service.
Welcome Welfare Recipients

Special Discounts 
to Senior Cilizens on all 

Prescriptions.
Dean Copeland 
Home 6b5-2698

lim T Pepper 
Businvs: 669-68% Home 669-9710
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Students
Attending

College
September me ans back to 

school for all McLean’s 
college student*. Here’s a 
partial list. We 1 ope to have 
more nest week:

Darla McAnear is attend­
ing Stenographer Institute of 
Texas in Abilene, TX.

Jim Ridgeway, student at 
Texas Tech, Lubbock, TX

Kyle Woods, Texas Tech, 
Lubbock, TX

Dovie Ridgeway, Spartan 
School of Aeronautics at 
Tulsa, Okla

Danna Watson, Texas 
Tech, Lubbock. TX

Trace Hess, Texas Tech, 
Lubbock, TX

OomlmEoin
HIGHWAY 287

OTOR COMPANY

Cl a r e n d o n , t e x a s

IHJICK • OLDSMOBILE

PONTIAC • CADILLAC • GMC TRUCKS 
Susan Brown Clarendon [806) 874-3527 ,
248-6241 Amarillo 376-9041
Groom, Texas 79039 Texas WATS [800) 692-4088 

— iW M W a a N M — r il

JASPER R O O FIN G  A N D
C O N STR U C TIO N

*
C O M M E R C IA L  8 R E S ID E N T IA L  

20 Y u r t  Experience

Free Estimai os References Guaranteed 

Repairs, Reroofs, Hot Tar, Cedar, 

Shake i, Composition t  Metal

1 -779 -2329 J«per

Stacy Hall, Texas Tech, 
Lubbock, TX

Tiffany Lopez, North 
Texas State University, 
Denton, TX

Melody Billingsley, West 
Texas State University, 
Canyon, TX

Misty Magee, Baylor 
University, Waco, TX

Dan Fish, West Texas 
S ta te  U n iv e r s it y ,  
Canyon, TX

Angie Glass, West Texas 
State University,Canyon.TX

Dolly Haynes, Oklahoma 
University, Norman, OK

Cal Holwick, West Texas 
State University, Canyon, 
TX

WOMEN SHOULD CHECK 
EARNING RECORDS

Women who have chang­
ed their names through 
marriage or divorce during 
their working careers should 
be sure to check their Social 
Security records to verify 
that all their earnings are 
credited correctly.

Married women who are 
self-employed need to check 
their records carefully too. 
According to the Internal 
Revenue Service, some 
married women who filed a 
joint tax return and were 
self-employed under their 
maiden names may not have 
their earnings recorded 
correctly.

Name changes should be 
reported to a person’ s 
employer and to the Social 
Security Administration so 
that a new Social Security

card can be issued. The new 
card will have the same 
number as the old card.

Although these steps 
should insure that a 
woman’ s earnings get 
recorded correctly, it is still 
a good idea to send for an 
review one’s earnings every 
three years. Errors can 
usually be corrected if they 
are identified early.

To get an earnings state­
ment, call Social Security 
and ask for a Form 
SSA-7004. Complete the 
form and mail it in. The 
statement will be sent in a 
few weeks. The service is 
free.

Social Security’s toll-free 
number is 1-800-234-5772 
and teleservice representa­
tives are standing by from 7 
a.m. until 7 p.m., each 
business day.

Country Corner A  

Texaco TtMC#
SUNDAY SPECIAL: 

licken Spaghetti, broccolijexas

Toast and Desert $3.99
Call In Orders Welcome 

Country Burgers Everyday

EXIT 142 McLean 779-2391

Public Notice
Southwestern Bell Telephone Company has filed an 

application with the Texas Public Utility Commission to introduce 
new optional services -  Call Control Options. The initial service 
areas will be Laredo, McAllen and Austin. Expansion into other 
service areas will be based on availability. Customers in other 
areas will be notified when these services become available.

Call Control Options include 3ix new services -  Call Blocker, 
Call Cue, Call Return, Priority Call. Call Trace and Selective Call 
Forwarding. The features will be available to single-line residence 
and business customers.

Call Blocker -  enables the customer to block incoming calls 
from a maximum of three specified telephone numbers and/ 
or to block the.last incoming call.
Call Cue -  enables the customer to automatically redial the 
last outgoing telephone number dialed. If the recalled num­
ber is busy equipment will monitor the line for a maximum of 
30 minutes and will let the customer know when the call can 
go through.
Call Return - enables the customer to automatically redial 
the telephone number of the most recent incoming call. If the 
number is busy Call Return will continue to dial the number 
for up to 30 minutes, or until it completes the call.
Priority Call -  provides the customer with a distinctive 
alerting signal, ring or Call Whiting Tone (if the customer has 
subscribed to Call Whiting), when the customer is called from 
a maximum of three preselected telephone numbers. *
Call Trace -  enables the customer to initiate a trace of the 
last incoming call received. The number, date and time will 
be recorded by Southwestern Bell Telephone so that the 
call’s origin can be identified.
Selective Call Forwarding -  enables the customer to for­
ward incoming calls from specified telephone numbers 
(maximum of three) to another telephone number.

Proposed Rates 
(monthly)

Individual Packaged Individual Packaged
Can Blocker $3.00 3.00 $3.00 2.00
Call Return 3.00 3.00 4.00 3.50
Priority Call 2.50 1.00 3.00 2.00
Call Cue 2.00 2.00 4.00 3.50
Selective Call 

Forwarding 2.00 1.00 2.65 1.00
Can Trace '* 1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

Installation charges for residence customers will be $2.70 
per feature.with a maximum installation charge of $5.40 per 
request per line. Installation charges for business customers 
will be $5.40 per feature, with a maximum installation charge of 
$10.75 per request per line.

The proposed date for Call Control Options to be offered is 
October 7,1990. These services, however, will not immediately be 
available to all customers in all areas of the state. Customers in 
other areas will be notified when these services become available.

Call Control Options are projected to generate first-year 
annual revenues of $1,900,000.

Persons who wish to comment on this application should 
notify the commission by September 27,1990. Requests for 
further information should be mailed to the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas, 7800 Shoal Creek Boulevard, Suite 400N, 
Austin. Texas 78757, or you may call the Public Utility Commission 
Public Information Office at (512) 458-0256 or (512) 458-0221 
teletypewriter for the deaf.

© Southwestern Be l 
Telephone

• ‘ ̂ ^ i *i^ePh°^e.? ,U'-Pmt>nt m ayno,be c o m p *'*** with Priority Call Service, 
m addition to the $1.00 monthly rate. Call Trace will cost $8.00 per use.
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All ads cash with order 

unless customer has an 
established account with 
The Groom or McLean 
News.

Far Sale Mayroth 12 volt 
drill filler grain auger 
S250.00. 248-7035.

Need someone to sit from 
6:00 p.m. to 10:00 p.m. each 
evening Monday through 
Friday. Please call 779-2679.

Far Salei 24 foot house­
boat $3500.00 or best offer. 
Call 248-7395. n

for sale,

Want to do custom com
harvesting. Contact Gary 
O 'N eil 883-2044. White 
Deer.

248-7057.

For Sale: Quantum Hybrid 
seed wheat. Excellent graz­
ing and yield potential. Call 
Tracy Kotara at 883-2221 or 
883-6571.

-Ballet. Tap. 
Jazz. Gymnastics, ages 3 
and up. 883-6031. White 
Deer....................

One Bedroom Trailer
House for rent, furnished 
see at Bill and Sam's Trailer 
Park or Call 248-7048.

Back to school garage
sale. Alberta Beauty Shop. 
215 N. Main St., Sept. 8th, 9 
to ?. Lots of bargains-last 
time.

King size water bed
$60.00. 5 oak chairs $40.00 
each, square walnut end 
table $75.00, 248-7341.

Bay Multi-Peril Crop 
Insurance on wheat and 
other small grains. Closing 
date is September 30. 
Bromley Insurance Agency.

Why Rent? Homes for 
51.00. Repos. Gov’t give 
away programs! For infor­
mation 504-649-0670 Ext
R 1725.

Seed W heat for sale: TAM  
200. regular and certified, 
cleaned. Bin Run also.Dan 
Steed. 248-7982. n.

R & L  Pest 
Control

-landscapes 

-Homes 

-Businesses

“ “ ' I

I 
I

I

I
I

Phone 944-5513 \

STOP N SHOP
244-7977 G r o m  TEXACO

[Everyone’s Con lenience Store

See Us For Your 
Picnic Needs 

And
Lake Supplies...

Baby sitter to come to 
home and care for two 
children during the day and. 
another one after school, one 
day per week alternating 
days. Call Angela Looton, 
248-7384.

ACREAGES-10-15-20 
acre tracts, 3 miles east of 
Groom on all weather road. 
Possible owner financing. 
Contact Bill Homer, 
248-7564.

Country Junction

Balloon Bouquets 
For All Occasions 

(We Deliver) 
Also-mop doll supplies 

D&C 10c skein,Acrylic Paint 
$1.00 while supplies last.

For Sale: 15 Foot Fiber­
glass fishing boat , 40 
H orsepow er, Everrude 
motor,new controls,$550.00
or best offer. Call 248-7395.

Typist - $500.00 weekly at 
home! Information: Send
self-addressed, stamped 
envelope. Honey, P.O. Box 
6509, Charlottesville. VA. 
22906.....................

For Sale: Concert Grand 
Upright Piano, $300.00 or 
best offer. Call 248-7395 or 
248-7048.

MCLEAN LODGE 
No. 889 
A FA  A M

Stated Meeting 
2nd Thursday 

Practice Every Monday 
7:30 p.m.

VISITORS WELCOME 
OilnJ. Weldon, W.M. 

J. Boyd Smith, Secretary

Wieberg, 

Welding 

Nathan Wieberg 

Shop-248-7270 

Home-248-7301

For Sale: 3 bedroom house 
in McLean. Owner will 
consider carrying note with 
down payment. Call
779-2189.

Wheat pasture wanted,
806-874-3285 or
874-3123................

LEGAL NOTICE

The Carson County 
Commissioners Court is tak­
ing bids on the following:

Proposals for Medical 
Insurance Coverage for 
Carson County Personnel.

For information needed in 
order to submit a bid, please 
contact Jay R. Roselius, 
Carson County Judge, 
Panhandle, Texas.

This procedure and notice 
is in accordance with Chap­
ter 262 of the Local Govern­
ment Code, Vernon’s Texas 
Codes Annotated, which 
requires publication of this 
notice at least one time 
before the 14th day before 
the date of the bid opening. 
Bids are to be delivered to 
Agnes Bell, County Auditor 
of Carson County, Texas, 
prior to 10:00 a.m.,
September 24, 1990, the 
date and time at which such 
bids shall be publicly 
opened, read and consider­
ed by the Commissioners 
Court. The Court shall 
award the contract to the 
responsible bidder who 
submits the lowest and best 
bid, or reject all bids and 
publish a new notice or take 
such other action as 
authorized by said Local 
G o v e rn m e n t C od e . 
Additionally, the award of 
the contract, if at all, shall 
be made to the responsible 
offeror whose proposal is 
determined to be the lowest 
evaluated offer resulting 
from negotiation, taking into 
consideration the relative 
importance of price and 
other evaluation factors in 
accordance with Section 
262.030 of said Code.

A. J. Newsom 

Water Well 

Service

Submersible Pumps 
Aeromotor Windmills

Phone 248-7411

//Your Homelown Store
/#

# ------------------- ---------------------------

Now Selling

Multi-Peril 
Crop Insurance

Brumley Insurance 
Agency

GROOM, TEXAS .
J o h n n y  B rum ley, A g e n t  ^  

^ ‘ Office 248-7550 Home 248-7315
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Pav's Service
C om e See Us

For Y ou r A u tom otive  N eeds! 

Oil-Batteries 

Complete Line Of Tires 

& Service
Wholesale Deliveries 

Retail-Regular-Unleaded

M o n -S a t., 7 :0 0 a.m . to 6:00 p.m .

C a rso n  C o u n ty  A b stra c t  Co.  
Realtors, Abstractors of Titles

222 Main St.

■CUSTOM'

537-3561 Panhandle, Tex

SW A T H IN G  A N D  B A L IN G
Small square bales and 

round bales.
. Custom fanning.

Larry Bennett
^ 7 / ^ , 8 7 4 - 5 0 0 8

m m M

MARK BIVENS 
(806) 2467010

BIVENS AUTOMOTIVE
24 HOUR WRECKER SERVICE 

HWY 66 & TEXAS 
GROOM, TX 79039 

(806) 248-7471
JACK BIVENS 
(806)246-7966

3 CUSTOM ROOFING
Free Estimates 

Prompt & Efficient

Hand nail all composition & shake roofs. 

Check our prices first I

Junior Crump 806-856-5336

Swanson Construction
Remodeling-Additions-New 

Home Construction-All Concrete 
Work-Metal and Asphalt 
Roofing-Ceramic Tilrng- 

Carports-Cabinets 
Call Larry at 779-3101 or -2950

QUARLES BODY SHOP
Body Pick Up ft Delivery, Painting

Frame within 30 miles All Work 

R ick  Quarles, Owner Guaranteed

Bus:806-835-2523 Res: 806-835-2939

100 E. 10th P.O. Box 371 Lefors,Tex. 79054
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by-Ed Blar kwell. District 
C onscrvationist

So far, the year of 1990 
has not been * good - ear for 
seeding gras: in most of 
Carson Count/ due to lack 
of rainfall. 'Vith a good 
amount o f rainfall in 
September an I frost holding 
off, we could t ti" get a lot of 
grass establisl ted in our CUP 
program. S sveral other 
producers ae< dcd grass for 
immediate (.razing after 
establishment. We would 
like to ask eat h CRP partici­
pant to look at their CRP 
land during the next few 
days and If hey have tall 
weeds that nay blow onto 
adjoining lan I after froat-to 
shred the*': weeds by 
September 15. This will also 
give the grai s a chance to 
establish sho Ud we get the 
rains in ScpCmber. During 
1990. our spring and 
summer rail fall has been 
less than SO (ercent at what 
the years of 987. 1968 and 
1969 rainfall tecorda show in 
the Panhand e area. These 
years were 'cry  good for 
seeding graai.

Concern inj wetlands, 
those who hive a question 
on this need to contact us. 
The law wai put into the 
196S Farm I Ul and it still

remains. Plays lakes that 
have been determined to be 
wetlands may not be drain­
ed, filled or modified with­
out the possible loss of 
USDA program benefits. If 
the areas are being fanned, 
they may continue to be as 
long as no additional modi­
fications are made. Modifi­
cations of playas made prior

to December 23, 1985 can be 
maintained. For more infor­
mation on conservation 
programs, please contact the 
local SCS office-phone 
537-3732. All programs are 
established for eligibility 
without regard to race, 
color, religion, age, sex, 
handicap, or national origin.

GEORGE R. WALTERS, M.D., P.A.
Is Pleased To Announce The Association Of

RONALD W. INGRAM, M.D.
In The Practice of Ophthalmology 
Diseases And Surgery Of The Eye

Julia Lyles Awarded Scholarship
Mary Julia Lyles of Groom 

has been awarded a one year 
S I,000 Clark Foundation 
scholarship by the Texas 
In tersch o lastic  League 
Foundation. The Clark 
Foundation awarded 17 
grants to students who have 
participated in the UIL 
Academic State Meet 
Contests and who have 
compiled an outstanding 
record of academic and 
extracurricular achieve­
ment.

This year the TTLF award­
ed 213 new awards and 
renewed 153 awards for a 
total of 366 scholarships for 
1990-91 with a value of 
$489,900. Recipients may 
attend any approved college 
or university in Texas.

A graduate of Groom High 
School, Lyles placed seventh 
in the 1990 UIL State Meet 
Accounting contest. She has 
also participated in UIL 
News Writing, and Headline 
Writing contests. Her high

Regional 911 

Committee Appointed
The folio* ing individuals 

have been a /pointed to the 
Panhandle iegional 9-1-1 
N e tw o rk  A d v is o r y  
Committee: Cindy Camp­
bell. Claadi: Chief Mike 
Smith, Borgi r, Sheriff Terry 
Timmons, (arson County; 
Sheriff Lotn ie Rhynes, 
Castro Cow ity; Chief Bill 
Hinton, Ch Idress; Sheriff 
John Rainey. Collingsworth 
County; Dee Dee Sifkientes, 
Dalhart; SI tariff William 
Thompson. Jonley County; 
Chief Lloyd Neice. Friona; 
Judge Bob C ober, Hemphill 
County; Jay Spain. 
Hereford; Commissioner 
Ross Zen >r, Lipscomb 
County; 'Thief Robert 
McGuire. Memphis; Larry 
Payne, Moore County; 
Donnie A llred, Oldham 
County; Cl ief Jim Lara- 

Pampa; Chief Joseph

You Are Invited To An Open House

WhITE DEER VETERINARY CLIN IC

Sunday, September 8, 1990

1:00  -  J.*00 p jn .

Refreshments *  Free Samples

Help Us Celebrate The Opening

O f Our New Clinic

school activities and honors 
include FHA (4 years); 
Student Council;Basketball; 
selected All-District Basket­
ball Team (1990); Girl 
Scouts; Newspaper . staff; 
yearbook staff;Track (2 
years); Amarillo Globe News 
Panhandle Hall of Fame 
nominee 1990; Pep Gub; 
April (1990) Citizen of the 
Month; and JETS. Lyles 
plans to attend Wayland 
Baptist University and major 
in Business.

l T - i

r e g i o n a l

F Y F
C EN TER

806/665-0051

107 W. 30th Street 
Pampa, Texas 79065

Out Of Town Patients 
____________  1-800-322-3931 _

Han on, Perryton; Sheriff 
Lando Brown, Roberts 
County; Chief Art Taylor, 
Shamrock; Sheriff Jack 
Haile, Sherman County; 
Chief Joe Raper. Spearman; 
Sheriff Jim Adama, Wheeler 
County.

The Advisory Committee 
will be responsible for over­
sight of implementation and 
on-going operation of the 
Panhandle Regional 9-1- 
1 Network, the network will 
be made up of 24 counties 
and 55 cities in the Pan­
handle. Total plan imple­
mentation coat is estimated 
at Sl.615,360.

It is anticipated 9-1-1 
service will be available to 
the entire Texas Panhandle 
region by January, 1992.

For further information on 
the 9-1-1 Network, contact 
Pamela Nielsen at 372-3381.

■ n
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Dodge

TO S1000 BACK!'
Podge Cod often aerodynamic styling, room lor live, and the 
convenience d  a hatchback tor al your gear. Now gel $750 
cash bock. $1000 on CoR GL & GT, and a kw clearance price

S750K»0*’
Dodge Spirit ie a sedan with pianty d  performance, 
plenty d  room tor the tardy, and plenty d  wriue too. Gat 
$750 cash back now. Don't miss your chance to save!

Dodge DBQ h *su e  pickups are tough to beat With the 
highest pickup cash back around -  *2000! $1500 on Club Ctb. 
*1000 on diesel models. Savs big now, baton it's too tote!

s1500Sro«0%
Dodge Dakota has room tor three n the cab and remasu the only 
true mtdsia pickup around. Plus its clearance pneed to mate and 
has $1500 Back $1000 on Dakota S& Club Cab models.

T M E ID  MOVE ON BIG CASH BACK 
AND LOW CLEARANCE PRICES.

The '91's  are coming soon, so now’s the time to move! We re clearing out 
our inventory to make room. Now you can save big on a full lineup with low 
clearance prices. And big cash back on most models, too.
'C a sh  back or low financing lor qualified buyers thru Chrysler Credit (0 %  A PR  or longer term 
financing on indicated models). Must buy from stock

Boatuor urn n tA S i atm SAtwr.

$2000

Advantage:
DodgT

n

BURTON CHRYSLER DODGE

1 -826-5588 Wheeler, Texas
• •
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Bill And Sam’s Enterprises Expand
Garage, And LaundryTo BBQ ,

Groom is getting two n tw 
businesses thanks to the 
expansion of Bill and Sam's 
Enterprises. Grand opening 
for "B il l  and Sam’ s 
Bar-B-Qoe”  and "B ill and 
Sam's Laundry" was Sept. 
4th.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Ri ey 
have lived in Groom since 
1967 when they porchaied 
the. then called, L.A. M o el. 
Mr. Riley is retired frnn 
Coca-Cola Co. They run all 
their businesses themselv *s. 
"Sam’s the brains and I'm 
the maintenance man.”  slid 
BUI. These include BUI < nd 
Sam's Bar. Motel. Laura try. 
Auto Repair and Trader 
Park.

The latest addition, the 
Bar-B-Que, will open at < :00 
• m BUI wUI be doing the 
cooking and invites every » e  
out to sample his spec sli­
ces. The laundry will be

open for business from 6:00 
a.m. until 10:00 p.m. daUy.

The RUey’s have five 
children. They are aU grown 
and out on their own except 
Connie who helps run the 
motel. The others are Gary. 
Ginny, Jimmy and Pattie. 
An interesting personal note

Groom Tiger's officially 
kick-off their 1990 season 
this Friday night at 7:00 
p.m.. facing opponents from 
Alamo Catholic School of 
Amarillo.

“ TCB”  or “ Taking Care 
of Business”  has become 
the theme of team members 
during the two pre-season 
scrimmages. The meaning 
of the phrase is descriptive

born in E. Germany where 
she met and married BiU 
who was Marine guarding 
the American Embassy 
there. The day after the 
Berlin Wall came down she 
received a call from a sister 
that she thought had been 
killed by the Russians. It had

of how every player intends 
to play. Each one wUI be 
doing his individual best to 
do his job as part of the 
team.

Senior Robert Miller said, 
“ This should be a fun 
season! Football in Groom 
should keep getting better 
and better!”  Being one of 
the “ Old”  men on a rela- 

See FootbaU, Pg. 4

out Mrs. RUey...She was
been over thirty years since 
she heard from her.

Season Kicks O ff Friday

City Water 
Expansion

Mayor A1 Homer and 
Councilmen Jimmy Britten 
and Bill Homer met last 
week with interested parties 
about how soon to begin 
work on Groom’s water 
system. The work is made 
possible by a grant designed 
to help cities meeting 
specific criteria.

The group meeting was 
held to let each interested 
group know how work was 
expected to proceed. In case 
of unforseen problems each 
will know who to call and 
how to get in touch with 
them.

Work is expected to begin 
on October 1 at the fire 
hydrant on the south corner 
of the school. “ The work, 
when finished, wUI upgrade 
our fire rating with the State 
Fire Marshall’s Office and 
hopefully lower property fire 
insurance,”  said City 
Secretary Pat Ashford. 
Depending on the weather 
the work will be finished in 
180 days. Residents wUI not 
be inconvenienced by the 
work as all streets and drive­
ways will be bored, rather 
than ditched. Mayor A1 
Homer said, “ We are look­
ing forward to getting 
started.”

Groups represented were 
See Water, Pg. 3

AFTER GAME PARTIES

All Junior High Students 
are invited to the after game 
fellowship for food, games 
and fun at the Church of 
Christ.

All High School students 
are invited to the Baptist 
Church for after the game
activities!

NOTICE

The City of Groom has 
been notified by B.F.I. that 
they will not be allowed to 
pick up tires in garbage 
unless they are shredded.

A Defensive Driving
course will be held at 
Clarendon College on 
Saturday, September 8, 
1990. It will meet from 8:00 
a.m. to 5:00 p.m. in room 
101. The fee is S25.00. 
Please contact Garendon 
College at 1-806-874-3571 
for further information. 
Upon completion of this 
course, participants will be 
eligible for a 10 percent 
discount on their liability 
insurance or dismissal of a 
traffic violation. All 
dismissals of traffic viola­
tions must be approved by 
the appropriate Justice of 
Peace.

Country Neighbors • will 
meet Sept. 12, 10:00 a.m. at 
Alice Kuehler home.

Troop 21 - Junior Girl 
Scouts will meet Thursday at 
5:00 p.m. in the Girl Scout 
Room at the Community 
Center. Any girl in the 4th, 
5th or 6th grade who would 
like to know more-bring 
parent to meeting or call 
Donna Burton 248-7453.

Chowllne Meant Sept. 7, 
Friday-Goulash, cabbage 
slaw, garlic breads dessert

Sept. 11, Tuesday:Fried 
chicken, gravy, french fries, 
salad, hot biscuits, dessert

Carson County Farm 
Bureau will hold its annual 
C ou n ty  C o n ven t io n , 
Tuesday, Sept. 18th at 7:30 
p.m. in the War Memorial 
Building. A barbecue dinner 
will be served. Bob Gibens 
of KGNC radio will be the 
guest speaker. Tickets are 
$5.00 per person

TUESDAY GRAIN PRICES 
AT LOCAL ELEVATORS

Cash prices on grain 
posted at grain elevators 
serving the Groom area 
•Tuesday afternoon:

Wheat-S2.14 
MUO-S3.75 
Corn-$3.95
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Evelyn Hubbart Named New 

Librarian For Groom
At a meeting on August 

27th of the Carson County 
Commissioner's Court, Mrs. 
Evelyn Hubbart was 
appointed Librarian of the 
Groom Branch of the Carson 
County Library to fill the 
vacancy created by the 
resignation of Mrs. Bertha 
Knight on July 31st.

Mrs. Hubbart has been 
the Library substitute for 3 
years and is also a member 
of Groom Library Friends. 
She has been a resident of 
this community 5 years hav­
ing moved here from 
Amarillo to make a home for 
her mother, Mrs. Edna 
Russell, now a resident of 
St. Ann’ s Home in 
Panhandle.

Mrs. Hubbart enjoys 
reading, knitting and 
crocheting and traveling to 
see her two daughters in 
California and Ohio, five 
grandsons, two grand­
daughters, two great-grand­
daughters and one great- 
grandson. .

Patrons are invited to visit 
the Library and to apply for a 
new card.

Mayor Homer 
Announces

( Community Calendar

Athletic Boosters 
will meet immediately after 
Thursday night Junior 
Varsity Football game on the 
football field.

Please note change i
Baptist Church will host SOS 
on Sept. 20th. Church of 
Christ will host SOS in Oct.
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Local Happenings
Mr. and Mrs. A1 Alward 

visited Bessie Mae Arnold 
Monday.

Mark Bivens is currently 
attending Amarillo College. 
His name was inadvertently 
left off the college list.

Somehow Magan Bivens 
name was left off the 
September birthday list. We 
wish her a lovely birthday on 
September 6th.

Rip and Joy Snyder and 
Gloria Ledwig returned 
home Thursday after visiting 
a week in the home of Cobb, 
Kay, Joe and Frances 
Britten. They reported a 
wonderful time and 
Gothenburg is a lovely town.

HOSPITAL LIST

Jake and Vivian Lacy 
treated Roza Lopez to a 
Chinese dinner Sunday for 
her birthday at the Ming 
Palace in Amarillo.

They also visited their 
new  g ra n d d a u g h te r , 
Cheyenne Keeton Downy, 
born August 28th at North­
west Texas Hospital,

Magan Bivens had a mis­
hap Friday on the bumper 
cars at Wonderland Park. 
She had a hairline skull 
fracture. The family stayed 
over the weekend in 
Amarillo in case there were 
complications. Magan is the 
daughter o f Mark and 
Tammy Bivens.

SEPTEMBER CLINIC 
SCHEDULE

Postmaster: pl< ase send address changes to:
Box 460. Gro >m, TX-Phone 806-248-7333 

SUK CRIPTION RATES:
Annual Rate Carson County S14.d0
Annual Rate elsewh, re in the United States S16.00

Mr. and Mrs. Max 
Summers came to the 
hospital in Amarillo to be 
with her father during his 
surgery. Linda stayed a 
week after his return home.

Mr. and Mrs. Neusch and 
sons of Panhandle were 
“ dove season”  visitors at 
the Don Case home Sunday.

THANK YOU

NEW RESIDENT!

Welcome to new resi Jents 
Dick and Prissy Conml and 
family. He is son of 1 wise 
Conrad. Dick was raiaid in 
Groom. Prissy, formerly 
Prissy England, atte sded 
school here until heir 
marriage. Dick will be Iriv- 
iag back and fortl to 
Amarillo where he is the 
managing pharmacis: at 
Pro-Med Pharmacy. Pissy 
taught at St. M ary’ s 
Montessori School and *as 
Director of Preschool.

Mrs. Conrad said that 
they were enjoying livin j  in

Groom. What they really 
would like to do would be to 
build a home here. For now 
they are renting.to make 
sure that this is the right 
thing for them. They have 
always spent a lot of time 
here.

The Conrad's have six 
children; Shelly, the oldest, 
is married to Sean Buttran 
and live in Arlington where 
he is attending University iof 
Texas . They have a baby 
named Drew; April, a fresh­
man; Tara. 7th grader; 
Amber, 6th grader; Spencer, 
3rd grader and Racheal who 
is four years old.

Many thanks to everyone 
for the get well cards, the 
nice visits and the much 
needed prayers.

Marvin Morrow

CARD OF THANKS

We wish to express our 
appreciation for the flowers, 
cards, prayers and the visits 
during my stay at the 
hospital and at home. Also 
for the delicious food 
brought to our home.

Sincerely, 
BUI Cornett

F tX C

S t a t e  N a t i o n a l , B a n k

G room , T exas

M E M B E R

TAKE A IM  TO FUTURE 
FINANCIAL SECURITY!

L ANK AT HOME!
We are inte rested in the welfare o f our local 

community und more responsive to local and 

individual net ds than any out oftow n financial 

____________ im  titution could ever be!

Handling the 

financial needs 

ofG room

fo r  over 60years
\ •

Emmett Poynor, CCU, 
High Plains, Amarillo. He is 
Pat Ashford and Connie 
Stephenson’s brother.

Edna Copeland, Room 316 
Pampa. She is undergoing 
therapy and improving.

Maty Ann Britten, Room 
840, High Plains, Amarillo

The following are recu­
perating at Home: 
Donna Burger. Mel Prather, 
Jim Babcock, Bob Corbin, 
Nancy Blackwell, Tracy 
Britten. BUI Cornett, Max 
Wade, Dolores Prather, and 
Dennis Cockrell.

GROOM BIRTHDAYS
AND ANNIVERSARIES

September 8-Mrs. A. J. 
Babcock, Mr. and Mrs. L.A. 
Hudson

September 9-Mrs. Bill 
Hammers, Mrs. Gary W. 
Friemel, Garrett Arthur 
Britten.

September 10-Leonard 
Koctting, Daniel Lambert, 
Cody Ray Schaffer. Peggy 
Cave

September 11-Mrs. Don 
Case, Mrs. Dale Brooks, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wallace L. Bichsel

September 12-Mrs. Gary 
Don Davis

September 13-Mrs. R. L. 
Newton. T. Dwain Weller

September 14-Faith 
Pauline Looten

weighing 8 lbs.

NEW ARRIVAL

Grandparents Arnold and 
Doris Kuehler of Groom and 
Marion and Sylvia landres 
of Nowata, Okla. are pleased 
to announce the arrival of a 
baby grandson.

Travis Layne, born Sept. 
2. 1990, in Bartlesville,
Okla. weighed 7 lbs. and 3 
ozs. Proud parents are Kent 
and Cindy Kuehler of 
Nowata, Okla. Welcoming 
baby Travis home are 
brothers Bryan, age 7; 
Colby; age 2; and sister 
Jaymie, age 4.
. . . m t r m . m m

Happy

Birthday, Dad

From a young 1st

grader to an

old 1st grader!

Im m unization  c lin ics  
offering vaccines that give 
protection against several 
childhood diseases are 
scheduled for September. 
Protection is against Polio, 
Diphtheria, Lock Jaw 
(Tetanus), Whooping Cough 
(P e r t u s s is ) ,  M e a s le s ,  
Rubella and mumps.

The Texas Department of 
Health is charging money to 
help with the cost of keeping 
the clinic open. The amount 
of money charged wiU be 
based on fanuly income am) 
size, and the ability to pay.

T.D.H. wUl be at the 
Groom Area Clink on Sept. 
11th from 4:00 to 7:00 p.m.

RGM AG & GRAIN, IN C

Serving The Farm er’s 

N eeds First!

Herbicides and 

Custom Application

Full Line O f Chemicals

248-7551
248-7575
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THANK YOU

I with to express my dee; >
■ad tiacere appreciation t< 
all my friends that gave s< 
much help and comfort to
■e during the passing of nn
dear wife. Octie

A.O. Denningtoi

t h a n k y o c

Thanks to my family, 
relatives and friends for the 
visits, cards, prayers, 
flowers and phone calls 
during my stay in the 
hospital.

Alice Britten

r-The Land Bank.
Farmer owned. 

Farmer directed. 
Farm credit 
specialists.

B.aT7M 
a, TX 79114 

3SMM8

Bill & Sam's Garage
To Sarva Your Automotive Needs I 

24 H( ur Toering

404 E. F ron t Groom  248-7335

John Wagner 248-7940, nights

Good Luck Gixtom & M cLean

Tigers
BoB Claments, Inc.

F in * THIorlng, Dry C M nlng, Custom W indow*
1437 N. Hobart 665-5121

s r r A member n f the International Pabncare Imt.tute,
thr auociaitan o profession^ drycteancrs and laundcrers

Grand Opening
Bill & Sam ’s Bar B Que 

Tuesday, September 4

Book your 

Seed Wheat Now!

We have several 
varieties available.

Contact Mica or Bob.

We appreciate the 

opportunit v to serve you.

ATTEBURT GRAIN, Inc.

218-/591 Gr#om ,t§«af

Water
Dwight Brandt and Delk 
Watson, Engineers; Dwain 
Lane, contractor; John 
Sessions, Panhandle Plan­
ning Commission; Norris 
Hoyt, Producers Utilities; 
Don Case, Groom Water 
Department; and represen­
tatives from G.T.E.

NIGHT1N’ GALS NOTES

Nightin ' Gals met 
Tuesday, August 28th with 
Thelma Pool and Shirley 
Lamberson as hostesses. 
Other members attending 
were Pearl Batiks. Nettie 
Fields, Theresa W ills, 
Wynona Koetting, Barney 
Davis. Mary Britten. Sybil 
Brown. Evelyn Hubbart and 
Delores Prather. Guest for 
the evening was La Vesta 
Barnett.

Early in the evening each 
person received a present 
which remained unopened 
and could be exchanged 
until the close of the games. 
Also. Mary Britten won the 
door prize for low score. 
Evelyn Hubbart had high 
score.

Political
Calendar

The Groom News is 
authorized to present the 
names o f the following 
candidates for office, subject 
to the General Election on 
November 6. 1990. A fee of 
$35 has been paid by each 
candidate for listing in this 
column from now through 
th e  e le c t io n .

DEMOCRAT

For Carson County Judge: 
*Jay R. Roselius 

For Carson Co. Treasurer: 
•Peggy Butler 

For Carson Co. Treasurer: 
•Peggy Butler 

For Tax Ass nsnr-Coflector: 
Donita Herber

REPUBLICAN 
For U.S. Rep., Diet. 13t 
Dick Waterfield
•Denotes-Incumbent

WRITE-IN
For l  ax Aaoeaoor-Coflecton
•Rosalyn Watson

Carson County’s 1990 tax 
rate was increased 1.03 
percent by County Commis­
sioners in their regular 
session Monday, August 27. 
The current rate of .3017 
was raised to .3059 per $100 
valuation. The new rate 
breaks down thusly:.2205 for 
general fund, .0340 for 
lateral road fund, and .0514 
for special road fund.

Also receiving unanimous 
approval by the Court, with 
Commissioner Smith absent, 
was the proposed budget. 
During a public hearing 
prior to the proposed budget 
approval. Judge Jay R. 
Roselius said that the 
budget would allocate 
operating expenses of 
$81,249 for Precinct 1 
(Groom area), $87,106 for 
Precinct 2 (South Pan­
handle, south and west to 
the county line), $93,699 for 
Precinct 3 (North 
Panhandle, north and west 
to the county line), and 
$53,117 for Precinct 4 
(White Deer-Skellytown 
area). It was also explained 
that some monies would be 
taken from reserve funds to 
keep the tax rate lower and 
still provide the needed

resources while maintaining 
a safe reserve.

Roselius also reported 
that a verbal agreement had 
been made with Dr. Vezsey 
o f Amarillo Pathological 
Associates to do the 
County’ s autopsies.

A letter concerning small 
landfills was read from 
Upton County Judge Peggy 
Garner. She said that 
unofficial information from 
Washington,D.C. indicates 
that there might be some 
flexibility for areas of the 
state that receive less than 
25 inches of precipitation 
annually and for which no 
practical alternative waste 
management facility exists. 
Small landfills serve 
communities of less than 
5,000 people and receive 
less than 10 tons of fill per 
day. The Court had pre­
viously joined other small 
counties in the area in an 
appeal to the government to 
allow some flexibility in 
proposed rules governing 
landfills.

A letter from Roslyn 
Watson was also read, in 
which she stated she would 
be running as s write-in 
candidate for Tax Assessor-

1990 General Election.
Employment applications 

for the Groom Branch 
Librarian position were 
discussed, noting that nine 
applicants sought the job 
and that it was a difficult 
decision to determine who 
would be appointed to fill 
the position vacated by 
recent retirement of Bertha 
Knight. Evelyn Hubbart, 
who has been serving a 
substitute librarian at 
Groom, was approved for 
the appointment.

In other action, the Court 
approved advertising for 
Health Insurance bids. 

'Carson County is currently 
covered by Prudential 
Insurance Com panies, 
written through the Texas 
Association of counties.

Other announcements 
were that commodities 
would again be distributed 
in October and that Labor 
Day, Sept. 3, would be a 
holiday for all County 
employees.

The next regularly 
scheduled Court meeting 
will be at 10 a.m. 
September 10.

NOW OPEN •  •  •

Dr. Jack Albracht wishes to announce the 
opening of his new business

ALBRACHT
CHIROPRACTIC OF PAMPA

2216 N . Coffee

F or M ore  Information o r Appointment C a ll 353-9151
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Carson County Tax Rate Set 
By Court In Monday Session

Collector in the i>u«cinuer o,

BIG BURGER SALE!
BELTBUSTER*Tl* biggest of the big, wilh two
V* pound* pure bed bomestyfc patties!
Only at Daily Queen-'

HVNGR-BUSTER, /R* Bigger than i
regular burgers, with a V» pound- aO-beef patty 

and your favorite

n.99
sale ra c e

All for under 
a buck!

sali pvkl.

HUNGR-BUSTER*
Big burger, big taste! Ybugd 
a Vi pound 100% bed patty, 

served with fresh lettuce, 
tomatoes, pickles, and onions.

Delicious!

I V  Atm  I H M D  O Op. COWV fWO-U&PW.* ________ ____V . . .  „ „  ^  D.O .Op.aw Gooao^«part.opm n90»»y
Prices Good Sept 3-Sept 23,1990



THE TIGEI TALKS

Thi* years Tiger spirit is 
Shannon Fields. She will be 
giving us words of ad rice on 
how we can offer suf port to 
our teams through ootball 
season and later in lasket- 
ball season

This week the Tiger says.
"W ear Red and B ack on 

Friday! Go to the Pef Rally, 
don't just sit bacc and 
watch... PARTTCIPATEI If 
you don’t know the yells, 
just clap to the beat Wish 
the boys "Good Jickl”  
before and after ‘Good 
Job!" And when the Tiger, 
Talks... LISTEN!

Pep Rally-3:20 p.m
G a m e  t i m e - F r i d a y .  

7:00 p.m.

THANK YOU

Special thanks to lelen ;
Witt for the loving and 
caring poem "Brett" that |
she wrote in his meisory. 
Also, my deep apprec ation 
to one and all for your calls, 
kind words and prayer;.

Lucille Case and F imily

Football
tively young team, Robert is 
really impressed with what 
he has seen in younger 
members. “ There is really 
some talent there that just 
needs developing and seme 
experience.*’ Robert plays 
tail back and middle line­
backer.

Junior Brian Baker is also 
looking for a great season. 
His explanation of “ TCB”  

.doing whatever you have 
to-to w in !" Playing several

positions, like quarterback, 
running back and safety 
have helped Brian to become 
a stronger team member, 
explaining that this helps 
everyone to be comfortable 
with more than one job. 
Baker felt that this years 
toughest opponents would 
be Higgins or McLean.

Coach Jimmy Branch 
reports that both teams did 
well in last weeks 
scrimmages. Tiger Varsity 
scored 9 times, even though 
two T.D.’s were called back. 
Junior Varsity scored an out­
standing 14 times.

On 8-29-90, Trooper Gary 
Davis was called to investi­
gate a car-sheep accident in 
Groom. The driver of the 
1979 Buick, Carlene Britten 
of Groom, struck 2 head of 
sheep on Front Street. Miss 
Britten was not injuried but 
the sheep didn’t make it.

On 8-30-90 at 10:15 p.m., 
Trooper Gary Davis of 
Groom, stopped a 1983 Olds- 
mobile driven by James 
Cassidy of Euclid, Ohio for

traffic violations. Several 
baggies of marijuana were 
seized and Cassidy arrested 
for possession of Marijuana. 
Cassidy was booked into jail 
at Panhandle and the next 
day paid a fine of $634.50.

On 9-1-90, Trooper Gary 
Davis arrested a John 
Wagner of Groom for DW1.

Mr. Wagner was placed in 
jail and charged with DWI.

The Amarillo DPS office 
reports the final motorcide 
death count at 33. This is 
well below the expected 40 
they had estimated. Of these 
26 occurred at night, 17 were 
not wearing seat belts, and 
at press time 16 deaths were 
alcohol related. Only one 
death occurred in the Texas 
Panhandle near Hereford.



Mrs. Pearl Sargent of Can­
yon, TX.; and a host of other 
relatives and friends. 
Services were at 3:30 p.m., 
Wednesday, at the Laurel 
Land Funeral Home Chapel. 
Interment at Laurel Land 
Memorial Park.

The following poem was 
written by Helen Witt in 
memory of Brett. It was used 
in his funeral service.

B U T T
An angel came down to 
earth
and dwelt for a little while 
formed as a precious little 
boy
with fair hair and beguiling 
smile.

He brought both pain and 
gladness
with his helpless loving 
ways.
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and captured hearts about
him
in his life of treasured days.

Then he slipped into 
eternity,
resuming his rightful place 
to play in celestial gradens. 
secure in God’s embrace.

Helen Witt

ALL VARIETIES

COKES
6 PACK 12 0Z. CANS

$ 2 0 9

S ta rK is t

T U N A
6% 0Z. CAN

79*

HAM, EGG AND

BISCUIT

. 69°
Thank You For 
Shopping At Your 

Nearby Allsup Store. 

Com e By and See Us.

Open 24 Hours 
Everyday/

G R O O M  -
Prices effective Sept. 9 -1 5

White Su£plies Last

ALLSUP'S

BREAD
VA LB. LOAF

ALLSUPS

Scltiool
Parking Hazard

Back to school means in 
added traffic hazard 1 or 
drivers. Not only is there a 
need to watch out for lit le 
pedestrians but bicycles c m 
also prove difficult to see.

One area that is especia ly 
troublesome is the schtol 
parking lot. A few years a, ;o 
a concerned group i f  
parents along with the help 
of P.T.O. designed a parking 
method to ensure the safe ty 
of children who exit on tlie 
east end of the school. The *  
youngsters are main y 
elementary age and ther:- 
fore are harder to spot. Tlx y

are always in a hurry to get 
home, and do not watch for 
traffic as well as they 
should. Most teachers have 
trained them to walk in the 
CTOSS walk area that have 
been marked off for this 
purpose. When cars drive 
through this area, the 
children are not expecting to 
dodge traffic.

The diagram will explain 
where to park. Parents are 
urged to explain and 
encourage spouses, grand­
parents and student drivers 
to study the diagram to 
ensure the safety of the 
students.

Services Held
Brett Allen, age 17, 

passed away August 27, 
1990 as a result of chronic 
respiratory disease due to 
cerebral palsy which he had 
since birth. Survived by 
parents, Don and Emma 
Kay Sargent: sisters. Angela 
and Stacey Sargent; all of 
DeSoto; grandmothers, Mrs. 
Lucille Case, of Groom, TX.,
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GROOM ISO MENU

Sept. 10-Maa.i Breakfast 
Cereal, blueberry muffins 
juice and milk

Lunch-Corn dogs, pork A 
beans, onion rings, pickk 
spears, bread, buttet, choco 
late cake

Sept. 11, Tue.:Breakfast 
Pancakes, peanut butter 
syrup, juice, milk 

Lunch-Meat A  cheese 
enchiladas, pinto beans 
salad, picante sauce, chips 
milk, pineapple tidbits 

Sept. 12, Wed.iBreakfast 
Scrambled eggs, hash 
browns, toast, juice, milk 

Lunch-Turkey, noodles.

cheese sticks, green peas, 
buttered carrots, butter, hot 
sliced bread, milk, cherry 
cobbler

Sept. 13, Tha.rBreakfast- 
Bacon, biscuits, gravy, 
juice, milk

Lunch-Lasagne with meat, 
cheese, fried okra, salad, 
butter, bread sticks, milk, 
banana pudding

Sept. 14, FritBreakfast- 
Donuts, cinnamon rolls, 
juice, milk

L u n ch -R o a s t b e e f ,  
mashed potatoes, gravy, 
green beans, butter! hot 
rolls, milk, chocolate chip 
cookies

PRINTING *
248-7333

Envelopes - Girds - Invitations

» The Groom News j
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One Hour Martinizing
B ring your clean mg w hen you shop

in Pam p a .......

Pick it up the same day!!!!

Two location i to serve you- 

1807 N. Hobart-1824 W. Francis

MELL0 CRISP

SLICED
BACON

1 LB. PKG.

WILSONS

FR AN K S
12 0Z. PKG.

ALLSUP'S
FAMOUS...FRESH

BURRIT0S
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FATHER NEY13  
HONORED

Catholic Church hosted a 
c e le b r a t io n  h o n o r in g  
Richard J. Neyer’s thirty 
years in the priesthood. A 
celebrated mass began at 
6:30 p.m. with 17 priests and 
18 nuns from the areaImmaculate Heart of Mary 
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attending. Bishop Leroy T. 
Mathieson gave the 
message. A reception and 
dinner was held at the hall 
immediately following the 
mass. Lots of ftod and 
fellowship were en oyed by

Ward Palmer's

MUSTANG ARENA
CLAUDE

$40 Round Robin 
Saturday, September 8

Call226-2410 to pre-enter

Bioks Open 5:00 Rope at 7:00

1 rophy buckles to top 

header and heeler
Limit 20 x 20

0ver$1100 paid out in 2 weeks

parishioners and former 
parishioners of Father Neyer 
with approximately 160 in 
attendance.

Father Neyer wishes to 
thank all of the people of the 
parish and the community 
for their kindness and 
respect to the parish and for 
the priesthood.

Local Happenings

Last Wednesday, William 
and Floretta Neal o f ' 
Amarillo. A.D. Sc Ethel Neal 
Nellie Ford Sc Bertha Knight 
went to Clarendon to help 
their brother, Leslie Neal, to 
celebrate his 83rd birthday. 
Others enjoying the bounti­
ful picnic lunch spread on 
tables under the large trees 
in the back year were: 
Leslie’s wife, Dora; son 
Harold of Pauls Valley, 
Okla.; the Neal’ s close 
neighbors, Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Hunter, Mrs. Alyce Muden 
and Mrs. Edna Johnson.

The Friends of the Library 
will be sponsoring a used 
book sale in the month of 
October. All proceeds from 
the sale go to fund library 
projects.

Anyone having used 
books to donate to the sale 
may bring them by the 
library or to have your books 
picked up call Adela Kotara 
248-7585 or Marion Pool 
248-7286.

ESTATE

A dak Wooten Estate located at 422 E. 2nd, Shamrock, Texas. 

Saturday, Soptombor 8,1990 10:00a.m.
REAL ESTATE

REAL ES ATE TO I E  SOLD AT 12:00 p.m.,2 BR, Living, Dining, Dnn, Breakfast •rna. Kitchen, 

Office. Stucce hens#, separate garage. Inspectlen morning ef September • er any time by 

appointment. Seller has 30 minutes to accept er reject final bid.
FURNITURE

1- Badroom suite-double 
bed, dresser, chest of 
drawers
2- matchlng single beds, 
dresser, chest o drawers
1-double bed
1 - K e n m o r e  . s e w i n g  
machine, cabinet type 
1-dining room si ite, double 
drop leaf , am 4 needle 
point cover n a lrs  and 
matching buffet 
1-recllner 
1 -day bed 
1-desk and chali
1- mauve coach ind chair
2 -  green wlngback chairs 
1-coffee table
1-stereo tape pliyer 
1-window type refrigerated 
alrconditioner 
1-evaporated air:onditloner 
1-gas range 
1-Frigidair refrigerator

Irene Barth

256-2787 

Shamrock, Tx.

CALL:

OR
James Hefley 

779-3134 

McLean, Tx.

1-double drop leaf table 
and chairs
1- armchalr
2- TV stands
1- Eureka car vacuum
2- card tables and chairs 

Oisbes and Appliances
Nice crystal-pitcher, water 
glasses, sherberts, tea 
glasses, plates, etc.
Hand painted cups and 
plates (matching) 
1-Rosenfeldt pottery bowl 
1-wood salad set 
1-coffee maker

1-waffle iron 
1-vacuum cleaner 
1-large fan 
1 -toaster oven 
1-blender 
1-Presto cooker 
1-large lot of dishes (many 
old), cooking utensils, and 
various kitchen appliances 
4-pieces of luggage

Many Items tee 
te mention

numerous

FROM THE M A U R IT A  B U M P E R S  ESTATE:  

Bedroom sulto, coach, chairs, and many various Horns.

Antiques and Collectables

1-0ld Kodak camera 
1-Kodak Baby Brownie 
Special
1-tennis racket (65 yrs. old) 
1-set old binoculars and 

'leather case 
1-old 32 cal. pistol 
1-lot old books.

JA M ES  HEFLEY  
8412

We act as agents only. 
Terms of Sale: CASH 

Note: Please Br ng Your Own 
Check look

Not Responsible For accidents

H e

Auction Co.
MORE ITEM S  

EXPECTED  SALE DAY
Lunch will be available 
Winch truck available on sale day

TRI-STATE FAIR 
SEPTEMBER 17-22

The Coliseum entertain- 
ment will take on a different 
look at the 1990 Amarillo Tri 
State Fair, scheduled for 
September 17-22. Rather 
than musical concerts alone 
each evening, several shows 
involving other acts of enter­
tainment will be featured. 
Music, however, will be the 
order of the night for 
Thursday, September 20tli 
when the big Khiva Shrine 
Stage Band and the Khiva 
Western Swing Band will 
perform. The Khiva Stage1 
Band will have center stage 
from 6:30 p.m. until 8:00 
p.m. and the Shrine 
Western Swing Band will 
perform from 9:00 p.m. until 
closing. The Stage Band 
features a full stage band 
instrumentation of four 
trumpets, four trombones, 
five saxes, drums, piano, 
bass guitar and tuba. The 
Swing Band was organized 
in 1988 and features five top 
musicians, some of whom 
have played with such bands;

as Bob Wills. Fair-goers 
may want to just sit and 
enjoy or to dance to the 
music.

Friday night, September 
21st, will feature Gary 
Roberts performing his 
magical acts at 6:30 p.m. 
and 7:45 p.m. and then 
listening or dancing to the 
music of the Rowdy Ace 
Band from 9:00 p.m. until 
closing. Roberts has been a 
featured performer at fairs, 
shopping malls, night clubs 
and on television all over the 
United States and Canada. 
Be prepared for a bit of 
magic, a lot of surprises, and 
a lot of fun at the Gary 
Robert Show.

Visiting Evelyn Hubbart 
over Labor Day weekend 
was sister Juanita Brock 
from Dallas and from 
Tucson. Aria., her brother 
and his wife, Gordon and 
Lucille Utsler. They visited 
their mother, Edna Russell 
at St. Anne’s in Panhandle. 
They spent Monday touring 
Palo Duro Canyon and the 
Museum.

Britten Family Gathers
The Marietta Britten dan 

gathered August 26 to 
co m m em o ra te  va r io u s  
family celebrations. The 
festivities were held in the 
home o f Marietlen and Jerry 
Homfeld of Adrian. Among 
the family members honored 
for August birthdays 
included: Terrell and Becky 
Britten, Rebecca West, 
Marva Bichsel, Kristy 
Homfeld and Marietta 
Britten, who turned 781 
Becky Britten was also 
honored for recently obtain­
ing her Bachelor of Science 
Degree from West Texas 
State University. Other 
celebrations included the 
engagement o f Marva 
Bichsel to Mr.Bob Fries.

A delicious meal of ham­
burgers and all the trim­
mings was enjoyed by all. 
Ice cream and special

decorated cakes were served 
for dessert. Games and gab 
took place much of the 
afternoon.

Among those who were in 
attendance from Groom 
include: Marietta Britten; 
Bill and Georgann Hinson. 
David and Daniel; Lynn and 
Sue Britten, Leo, Kay Lynn 
and Cody; Charles Britten; 
and Terrell and Becky 
Britten.

Others in attendance 
were: Bryan and Cindy
Bichsel, CalUe and Dee <A 
Claude; Rebecca West o f 
Canyon; Jett and Lynette 
Major, Carey and Casey of 
Littlefield; Marva Bichsel of 
Amarillo; Bob Fries of 
Lubbock; Tom and Sandra 
Sweat and daughter of 
Amarillo; and Jerry and 
Marietlen Homfeld, Kristy 
and Roy of Adrian.

C & H Supply, Inc.
M cLm r , Texas 779-2209

Checkout Our Price Reduced 

Summer Products And Just 

Received Fall & Winter Supplies

M e  Lean
t

Video Quest

114M. Main Street 779-2311

Tape and VCR Rental

2/$3°° $5°°
Open Mon.-Sat. 12 -8:00 p.m.

* e s ^£  “TV ^
. V  Sound that ^
>  S A - v i-

A u c t i o n  C o .

W

McLean. Tx. 79057 Boa 42 (806)779-3154


