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With Polly

Prett meeting!hereafter w ill 
never be the tame without 
Cal. Cal Snyder,Dtnvcr City 
publliher, and to - publisher 
of the Morton paper, died 
Monday. Hit death was i 
shock to newspaper people 
all over Texas.

Cal was tile fair haired boy, 
with a quick, friendlysinilc 
that seemed to add warmth 
to any room he entered. A 
cheerful word, and a warm 
personality, always, without 
tall, won and held hit audi­
ence.

A newspaper man at heart, 
he was firm in hit convictions 
and sincere in his efforts for 
the betterment of Denver City 
and area. He was as Articrican 
as apple pic. Denver C ity and 
Morton lost a great publisher 
and friend.the newspaper clan, 
at well as the Middletons lost 
a truly valued friend.

NOSIN'

It was to refreshing to have 
a tele phone conversation with 
a lady last week, who said 
the was busy living life , at­
tending to ner own business, 
not that of her neighbors, tak­
ing care of her children and 
husband, and daily counting 
her many blessings.

She indicated that as long as 
folks have their health, there 
isn't really too much to con>- 
plain about., .  She went on to 
say we all have more now 
than we've ever had in our 
lives, and instead of spending 
time being thankful lor what 
we have, we are prone to 
complaint because the outlook 
for crops, etc. doesn't look 
too good this year. .We are so 
busy trying to make more 
money, that we fail to really 
live and enjoy what we do 
have.

She ended up by saying we 
could all get along on less... 
and might even De bet te r 
for I t . . .  At least the said, we 
would have more time for the 
basic things in life .

To me, it was so wonderful 
to find someone who spoke 
openly of their many blessings 
instead o f thei! troubles.. .

NOSIN'

Sudden thought: What a d if­
ferent world this would be if 
folks would only magnify their 
blessings, the way they do 
their troubles.. . .

Rltts l«M  Fir
R n i i m t i
Bnthir
Funeral services for W illiam 

L, Stubblefield, Amherst, who 
died Thursday, on his 53rd 
birthday, were held Saturday, 
at iOa.m. in the First Baptist 
Church in A mherst.

Rev. John Rankin and Rev, 
Wayne Perry officiated.Burial 
war under the direction o f  
Payne Funeral Home, Amherst.

Stubblefield was bom July 11. 
1910, In Floydada, He had 
lived in Amherst since 1926, 
when he moved from Floydada.

Survivors include one aa ugh - 
ter, Mrs.Bobby Malone, Li±>- 
bock, two listen, Mrs. L. H. 
Randolph, Earth, Mrs.Charlie 
Jarmsn, Littlefield, two bro­
thers, Jim Stubblefield, Am ­
herst, and Jack Stubblefield of 
Abilene, Kansas.

Pallbearen were J. W.Chap­
man, B. R. Steddum, J. E. 
Sherley, Corvin Pigg, PaulB. 
Bennett and W illiam  Bradley.

Mra.MarvlnBrown and Leslie 
Lewis visited the E. O. Light - 
foots after church Sunday night.

Ttu>, t&tfosVwbypm M  oftta Wo'iJtoi’Rick&it
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Large C n w J Attends Earth s Rodeo
The Annual Eiri'i Keitli-i 

closed SaturJiy night with a 
good attendance cstlliu'led for 
each night of the three day 

A pievent. Approximately 2,000 
people went through tin gates 
Thursday night, lor the free 
barbeque anJ the first night's 
performance. The estimated 
crowd for Friday night was 
1200 and Saturday night, ap­
proximately 1400 spectators 
were present lor the last pe r­
formance. miking the 10th 
annual rodeo one of the best 
ever held ill Earth.

Winners of the events m the 
three day affair include, Best 
A ll round cowboy, Ldd Work­
man. Lubbock, a pair of hoots 
donatcJ bv Lusk Boot Shop iu 
Lubbock. Calf toping, Dillard 
Knuckle ., Elida, N. M „ buckle 
douated by Earth Oil and Gas 
Co„Inc,; Bareback riding,Edd 
Workman, Lubbock, buckle, 
by Brownd-WIntc Equipment; 
Bulldogging, H .C. Zac key of 
Lubbock, Buckie, donated by 
Earth Pump & Machine Works 
Saddlcbronc riding,Edd Work­
man. buckle, given by Barton- 
Watson. L ie .; h e a d i n g  a.id 
heeling, spicer Gripn, Here­
ford, buckle, donated by Lay­
man Bros. Bui.nie Bull tiding. 
P n Wisln ii . Lul'fot. h I 
donated by Earth ElevJto . In 
>irls' barrel racing, Carolyn 
Tate of Clovis won a buckle, 
given by A to L  Fertilizer.

Fourteen year old Kathie 
Brownd, daughter o f M r ,ltd  
Mrs. Gene Brownd, won the 
Shetland pony that was given 
away by the Earth Jaycees,

Float winners in the parade 
Thursday, opening the rodeo, 
were the Cub Scouts, first 
prize of)15n Earth LiOtU Club 
second. $10 and Earth Rainbow 
Girls third prize o f $5, dona­
ted by the Earth Chamber of 
Commerce,

The Chamber of Commerce 
also awarded trophies to the 
three best riding clubs in the 
parade. Winners were Cochran 
County, Morton, first; Terry, 
County, Brownfield, second, 
and Portales, New Mon 0 
placed third.

A large crowd of spectators 
viewed the parade as it moved 
down Main Street.

Rev. Baldwin 
Holds Revival 
In Texarkana

Rev.M.B.Baldwin, pastor oi 
the Earth First Baptist Church, 
returned home Monday from 
Texarkana, where he led in a 
re-ival.it the West Texarkana 
Baptist Church, July 7 through 
July 14. R v.E.E. Anders is the 
pastor,

Bro. Baldwin reports that a 
tiemendous tevival was held 
with good attendance at each 
service. Bro. £ack Funnel I of 
Shreveport, Louisiana, led the 
singing at the revival.

Rev. George Worrell, pastor 
of the Janies Ave. Baptist 
Church in Fort Worth, brought 
the Sunday messages at Hie 
local church in the absence of 
Bro. Baldwin.
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I'lRSl Pi At. i WINNERS>>(,Th« Cub Scout float won first place honors in the 
Diursday it ; i.m. Hie float depicted "Fk < Govemi ent 
iagtou(Gregory Blovcf) through Kennedy, (Stove ivi idolphL The cewi 
•vi n i. prot rayed by Butch Hamilton. Jimmy Littleton ntdChrisBnx 
rhe Cub Scouts and their leader, Mn. Wilson, marrlu br ind t

W a tit­
le urc was Uncle 
J as flag beaters

Second Annual FFA  Hog 
Sale Hold Monday
The second annual local FFA 

Swine show was held at the 
Show Bam. Monday with buy­
ers from as far away as Sea - 
graves attending the event.

Thote were XI bred gilts and 
14 open gilts and boars on sale. 
Gross for the entire sale was 
$3, 916. 00. with the avenge 
on bred gilts of $1 >1.60. A v­
erage on the 14 head of ap­
proximately 100 pound boars 
and gifts was $4 J. 00.

Jerry Jones sold the top ani­
mal at a price of Jl'lU.nO. Jer­
ry's average OO 11 Im id 'I 
swine was f l 2 HI.

A total of eight exhibitors 
troniSnrmglakc School. Mule- 
shoe, M e a d o w ,  Wilson ii 
Hereford participated. I’ric 
received from the talc almost 
doubled market value,

E. G. G a s t o n ,  Spnngluke 
School agriculture instructor, 
reported that the sale was very 
successful and had largely im­
proved over last year, when 
the fust sale was held.

The local club would like to 
publicly thank the following I 
men,whoso graciously worked \ 
at the sale, tree of charge and 
Includes the Three D Auction, 
composed of Auctioneers Tuf- 
fy Dent. Mike Deni and Doug 
Lewis, and the Clerks. Harold | 
M iller and Perk Lee.

LLOYD KISER

Lloyd Kiser Now 
Assistant Manager 
A ! Piggly Wiggly

Lewis Andrews of Amarillo 
visited in the Clarence Good­
win home Saturday.

Newcomers
Mr. and Mrt. A. B. Odom 

Plamvicw, have purchased the 
Emm Harper house on NE 4th. 
at Fit Street, ud moved to 
their new home Sunday.

The Odoms bought tfic City
Drug Iroin Marcus Messer on 

May ..0, and took over the 
business at that time. They 
had resided inPlauiview since 

I.

WINNER OP THE SHETLAND PONY.. given by ih* local Jaycec club at the cloae of the three 
day garth M a o ,  Saturday night, was Kathie Brownd, 14 voat old I -lighter ol Mt. and Mrs,G, 
Brownd, Shown on the pony is 4 year old Dickie Brownd, kathic's brothel, who is q u i t e  
thrilled over his liner winning the pony.

Lloyd Kiser,Crane,has been 
employed as Assistant Man­
ager of Piggly W iggly, and 
began lus new dutiesMonday 
morning.

Kiser Tijs had four years ex­
perience in the grocery busi­
ness, associated w i t h  Food 
Mart in Odessa, and Safeway 
in Carlsbad, New Mexico.

K isci and Ins w ife, Janet, are 
the parents o f one child, Be­
linda, 14 months old, and arc 
members of the Church of 
Christ,

The Kisers have moved their 
furniture to Earth, but have 
uotmsiahhthcd residence,due 
to the housing shortage.

School Board 
Votes To Ropair 
Jr. High Bldg.
School boaid members met 

in a special meeting at 9a.m. 
Tuesday morning at the High 
School.

The members were faced j 
with making a decision on re- 
pairing the Junior High Build- ! 
•ng.

The group decided to repair 
the brick, and fill tin ctacki j 
on the building and replace j 
the hall flooring with new j 
material.

The boys' real rooms will be 1 
r«plastered and new plumbing j 
flxtureswlll be nut a lied.Patch 
plastering will be done where- 
ever nc-ded. AII the c J a i l  
rooms will be repainted, in 
preparation for the beginning 
of school.

Work will start Aug. land 
must be completed by school 
time.

Condensed milk was Invented 
by Gall Borden, a Texan.

Junior Choir 
Presents Program 
A t Am herst Church

iwciuy five Junior Choir 
members from the IocjI Bap­
tist Church journeyed to Am ­
herst Sunday night and presen­
ted a sacred song program to 
the First Baptist Church con-

fpegation during the worship 
lour.
The Junior Choir under the 

direction of Duane Harris, ac­
companied by Alice Jaquess, 
presented nine inspirational 
tongs, and were highly praised 
hy members of the congrega­
tion.

Donna, Amnta and Connie 
Kelley, daughters of Mr. and 
Mrs. Don,i Id Kelley, presented 
a song, "Colne Sinner Come" 
accompanied by Duane Harris.

Several patents from Earth 
also attended the program and 
were deeply inspired by the 
message in *ong that was pre* 
vented by the group.

Jam es lackeys 
Purchase Local 
Ice Business
Mr. and Mn. James Lackey 

have announced the purchase 
of the local ice house and 
>now cone business from the 
Carroll Blackwells, with Mrs. 
Lackey managing tile business 

The Lackey's teside at the 
1.1 PasoNatural Gas Company 
C 'Hip, where Mr. Lackey has 
been employed for the past 
four yeair.. He was transferred 
here from the l'l Paso Plant at 
Hobbs, New Mexico, and is a 
repairman, employed by tin- 
company lor sixteen years.

The Lackey's attend the 
Baptist Church and ate the 
parents ot three sons,Vincent 
Glen, age 10. Edward Lynn, 9 
years old and Aubrey Gail, 7 
years old.

Mr. and Mrs. Lackey invite 
everyone to drop by for all 
ICC heeds and delicious snow 
cones, in all flavors, will  be 
available at the snow cone 
stand, and that business will 
be greatly appreciated.

Intermediate 
Boys Attending 
CampThis Week
Several Intermediate boys 

from thr [.m il First Baptist 
Church left Wednesday at 10 
a.m. fot (tie Plains Baptist 
Assembly neat Floydada for 
thlce days camp.

Duane Harris, youth director 
-ccompamed the group. Am ­
ong the Intermediate members

rslng were Jesse Cole, Fr< dJ\ 
e lley , Randy Kelley, Davy 

Habercr and Lonnie Adrian. 
The boys will return Friday.

Public Invited Tc Open House 
Sunday At Norman Suber's Home

Viola and Robert Gilmore of 
Silvrnon visited then father, 
Joe Gilmore, Saturday thiough 
Monday.

Open house at the lovely 
Gold Medallion home of Mi. 
m 4M zjlo ttn aa  Sulscr on I vt 
Highway 70 will be held Sun­
day from I to 5 p. m.

The public is invited to tour 
this beautiful modern design 
three bedroom brick home, 
with 2150 feet of living space.

Tile from e ii t r a ii c c is of 
white and gold vinyl floor 
covering, and features a built- 
in cloak closet ill the hallway 
which separates the living 
area and the bedrooms.

The main attraction of this 
lovely home is the 22 x 18 loot 
sunken liv lug room, wim iv -  
acado green carpeting, cent­
ered by i huge white flagstone 
brick fireplace, on the east 
wall. The walls and celling 
are finished in antiqued ash 
panelling, with a lovely sky­
light in the ceiling. The living 
room also features indirect 
spot l i g h t i n g ,  that may be 
dialed lo any degree of bright 
ness desireJ. Sliding doors  
separate the living room from 
tile hallway and also the fam­
ily room.

The kitchen, den and dining 
room c o mb i na t i o n  features 
walls in natural ash panelling 
with white ceiling.Trie kneb- 
cii cabinets are finished in 
natural ash, with stainless steel 
double sink, built-in Suburban 
drop in range, and stainless 
steel dishwasher, electric can 
opener, m i x e r - blender and 
disposal. The cabinet top is 
covered ill white and gold 
flecked vinyl, sliding glass 
doors open onto patios on both 
the east and west sides of the 
family room. The kitchen Is 
altociihaucrd by a convenient 
circular snackbar. The utility 
room is built into the kitchen 
area, completely out of the 
way, on the west wall.

Tne west wajl in the 1C x 31 
family room was built especi­
ally tor built in book cases, 
folding desks, stereo and TV 
to be installed later, with spa­
cious storage above. The floor 
is covered in Elegante Arm­
strong, Flagstone pattern.

The long hallway separating 
the living area and tile bed­
rooms, is lirushed in natural 
ash panelling with off-white 
ceiling, with brown and white 
flecked wool carpeting.

The spacious It x 18 f oo t  
inastet Dcdroom features wall 
panelling in natural acorn ma- 
hog* ly and w h i t e  c e ilin g . 
111 gh 11 gli ting the room is a 
large 8xlt> dressing area, com­
plete w i t h  s pa c i o us  doub­
le closets, f e a t ur ing bifold 
doors. Lovely cinnamon carpet 
covers the hoot of the master 
bedroom and dressing area.

The master bathroom features 
a specially made sunken tub, 
built of white and gray ceram­
ic tile , and round stainless 
steel sink. The walls are in 
natural acorn mahogany panel­
ling, with a ceiling heater and 
large glass brick window.

Hie Suiter's son, Carl's bed­
room is 21 x 15 with lovely 
mam la mahogany panelling, 
white ceilings,ennanced by an 
catly American light. Brown 
and white flecked wool carpet 
covert the (loot. On the cast 
wall, is a convenient built-in 
dressing table and hit closet IS 
built low, and will feature a 
but It - in bunk bed above It,

The girls' 13x15 loot bedroom 
is finished in natural mahogany 
panelling, white ceiling and 
double closets, w t l hb i f o l d  
doors. The carnet in this room 
is green and nine wool. The 
celling light is wired with a 
dimmer switch, for the 
convenience.

The second bath leads from 
the hallway and is finished in

white mahogany with spruce I 
fixtures and twin round 

stainless steel built in sinks. 
White viuylwilti flakes of gold 1 
and silver covert the dressing j 
table. The bathroom features 
marble vinyl flooring, floures- 
cem lighting and ceiling heat.

The lovely liome is installed 
with an intercom system with 
AM, FM radio inside and out­
side the house.

The beautiful home features

3,rl*

Westmghouse refrigerated air 
and central heating, installed 
by Kelley Refrigeration and
Service, P 1 a i n v ie  w . Each 
room is automatically weath­
er controlled for comfort.

A large double garage is 
built in the back, and has 
FI lumen, doors.

Everyone is invited to tout 
this lovely home Sunday from 
1 til 5 p.m. and view iu many 
lovely features.

Several Springlike Farm rs 
Hailed Out Saturday

Mure wile was added to area 
farmers Saturday afternoon, 
when approximately 26 or 30 
farmers in the Spnnglake area 
received Irom neavy to light 
hail damage during the cloud 
that swooped over ths> area 
around 7; 30 p. m.

Hail began to fall approxi­
mately two miles north of 
Springtake, and moved in a 
southeasterly direction to the 
sand hills, covering a four- 
mile area. An estimated ij 
inches of rain was received. 
A tornadic like wind hit the 
hog pens on the Sport Byers 
lariti,completely demolishing 
two cotton trailer beds and 
damaging one ol the hog pens 
when one ot the trailers was 
slammed Into it.

Lightning struck the J. B. 
James home during the height 
of the storm. Damage 
not available at press time,

Among the farmers reported 
hailed out or receiving dam­
age from the hail were Royce 
Bearden. Bill Clayton. Sport 
Byers, Wa y n e  Dav i t ,  C .O . 
Bibby, Hilbert Wisian, Flovd 
Crawford, Fred Smith, M.A. 
Parker, Kenneth Boone. Earl 
Watson,Doug Parish, Franklin 
Starkey, Jeu Matlock, K. B. 
and Orien Parish.

The feed received minor 
damage, especially to the 
heads. Mon f a r me r s  will 
probably plant pinto beans 
black eye peat and U was re­
ported that some may p la «  
millet.

FFA Convention Opened 
Wednesday In lubkeck
Victor Coker and Jimmie 

Smith, d e l e g a t e s  from the 
local FFA chapter, are atten­
ding the 36th Annual Texas 
FFA Convention In Lubbock, 
which convened at D i .n i ,  
W e d n e s d a y ,  in Municipal 
Auditorium.

A busy three-day agenda fa­
cet the 3600 delegates regist­
ered for the event. On the 
,-u w  will be the selection 

o f  a s t a t e  s w e e t h e a r t ,  
announcement  of top PPA 
award w i nn e r s ,  a public 
speaking contest, election of 
officers and other activities.

Victor Coker will be presen­
ted the Loan Star Award dur­
ing the convention.

Freshmen l u g u i  
Play Ends Monday
The Freshman League teams 

will end their make-up games 
Saturday, July 20. The Card­
inals beat the Mett 16-14 in a 
Close game Monday at 8 p.m.

The Cardinals m e e t  the  
Yankees at 8 p. m. Thursday, 
(tonight) and the Mcts and 
the Giants clash Friday night 
at th e  s ame  t i m e ,

Saturday night at 8 o'clock, 
the Giants and Red Sox will 
play and July 22, the Giants 
and Cardinals close out the 
season.

The league champion will 
play in the district tournament 
to be held at Floydada, July 
list. A birth certificate will 

be required for each boy who 
is to play,

Mr. and Mrs. David Cearle 
and children, Lubbock,

rley
and

Gary Scott from Ulinoia spent 
Saturday night and Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Ceariey.

Coopir Ritas 
Hald Monday 
In Springlain
Rites for O .H .Cooper.60, 

Warren, Arizona, were held 
Monday at 3 p . m .  in the 
Springlake Baptist Church. 
Rev. A . R. Stewart officiated, 
burial wat mPlalnview Cem­
etery, under the direction of 
Lemmons Funeral Home of 
Plainview.

Cooper died of a heart attack 
Wednesday. July 10. while he 
was at worst at the experiment 
farm of Phillips and Dodge 
Cotp.MlningCompany. where 
he had been employed the 
pan nine yean.

Survivors include his w ife, 
Bertha, four daughten, Mn, 
Howard McClure, Mri.Blllin 
Joe Nunn, both of Sntintlake. 
Mn. Bobby Low, Frederick. 
Oklahoma and Mn. Donald 
Packard.Olton. one ton. Ray­
mond Cooper, Paducah; four 
brothers, D oy I e , Quansh,  
Braun. ofChristabel in Panama, 
Jake and Velvln,both o f  Bis- 
bee, A r i z o n a ;  five listen, 
Mn. Alvin Ervin, Mrt.Gcatge 
Drybrcad and Mn. Hugh Beas­
ley all of Bisbee. Mn.Hazel 
Defore. Paducah and Mr t ,  
Sanford Mann, Sulphur Springs.

Pallbearen were Ray Powell, 
Bob Maxfieid, H.L. Reese, B. 
V . Padon. Carl Perlunt and 
Ernest Goforth.

Mr. and Mn. W.S. Graham of 
McAllen arrived Tuesday to 
visit with the Sam Coarlev*t6  
Kennth Cowley's. Mrs. Grah­
am it s sitter of Mn. Cnarlny 
and Mn.Cowley.

TIILS LOVELY HOME OF MR. AND MRS,NORMAN SULSER w ill be open to the public,
from I til 5 p. m. The home is located on East Highway 70, and has 2160 sq.ft, of living apace 
and feature) many elegant attractions. Everyone is urged to go by during the visiting hows SO
set this lovely home.
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Bridal Shower Honors 
Miss Jo Ann Middleton
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The J. L. Hutson home wss 
die scene of a come and io  
bridal shower, honoring Mu* 
|0 Ann Middleton, bride-erect 
of Glenn Built, Friday, from 
Si 30 til 5:30 p. m.

The serving table was laid 
with a lovely white linen cloth, 
centered with a beautiful ar­
rangement of pttrple a t t eu  
Mias Middlcton'tchosen colors.

Mutes Beck) Parish, Karen 
Jones, and Joan Dawson pre­
sented piano selections during 
the calling hours.

Kirs. Kenny Hamilton pre­
sented several vocal numbers. 
Accompanied by Mrs. Larry 
Tunncll.

Out of town guesti for the 
occasion were tne bomaree's 
mother. Mn. Leon Midd:eton, 
her aunt. Mrs.Archie Poole of 
Amarillo.

Hostesses were Mitts. H.S. 
Sanders, Kay Axtell.L . i .  Ang­
lin, V.D .Coker, Rex Clayton, 
Hilbert WltlJU. M. H. Been. W. | 
C. White. SamCcariev, John 
Lasng, R. H. Bele-w. Mucus 
Metier, W. W. Powell and Kcu- 
tieth Cowley.

The couple wsl. be married 
Saturday ,n the Sau Jacinto | 
Methodist Church >n Amarillo.

------------------------------------------f
W E S L Y A N  S E R V IC E  

11 G U I L D  M E E T S
• f l

The Wesleyan Service Guild I 
of the Earth Methodist Church ; 

* ,  met in the home of Mrs. C. P.
' Parish, Monday at 7:30 p, m. | 

Mrs.01tverTunneU presented 1 
the program on the United 
States.

,tb. Refreshmenu o f fruit punch I 
o n . and cookies were served to Mrs. j 
>c< Marcus Messer, Mrs^da Rudd, 

Mrs. Burl Hamilton,Mn. Floyd 
•n-. Burgess, Mrs. I unnell and the j 

hostess, Mrs. Parish.

P A N S Y  B E E N  
C E L E B R A T E S  
Uth B IR T H D A Y

Annual Raunian 
Of Hiram Stun 
Family Held
The Annual Hr rain Stone 

Family Reunion was held Fri­
day -nd Saturday in the Holi­
day Motel in Stcphenville with 
93 relatives and 21 friends from 
Texas andCalifornu attending 
the two day sffait.

Those Jttendi ng e n j o y e d  
group singing, \ utting, taking 
pictures and viewing movie 
film  of previous reunions.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert 0*Hair. 
Anita and Perry Don. Mr.and 
Mn. Ed O'Hau trended the 
reunion. Other brothers and 
inter* of the O’Hair family 
attending were Mr. and Mrs, 
Roy O 'Hau. Lubbock, Mi. and 
Mrs. Albert C a m p b e l l  and 
grandiughtert, Pat and P a m  
Campbell. Lubbock.

Mr. and Mn. Jim Stooc and 
Jimmy, Stcphenville, former 
Springlake residents, also at­
tended. Mt. Stone is an uncle 
to Robert and Ed O'Hau.

Other area relatives who at­
tended were Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Bonds, Edn ondson. Mn. Bond 
is a cousin of the O'Hatn.

MitHriist 
Intirmtdiafis 
Attwding Camp

KuiniirRiuniin 
Hald Siaday la 
laariai Spriags

Mr.and Mrs.Georac Kaunger 
and Mr. and Mrs. M. R. Burton 
attended the KasingerReumoo
at the Old Settler's Reunion 
Tabernacle io Roaring Springs 
Sunday.

Approximately 100 relatives 
attended the all-day affair. 
The day was spent visiting, 
taking pictures, and several 
in the group attended church 
services at the Church » f  
Chtut in Roaring Springs.

A ll of the brothers and listen 
in the Kasinger family attend­
ed with the e x c e p t i o n  of 
Charlie Kaunger of Hobbt, 
New Mexico.

Bcochers and listers attending 
were Mt. and Mn. Henry John- 
soq. Sundown, Mr.and Mn. M.

l e w s  Of  I n t e r e s t  To Women
a m

Kaunger. Earth, kft. and M  
B 111

R.Burton. Mr. and Mn.George 
Mn.

Tom Kasinger and children, 
Anson: Mn. Charlie Kaunget, 
and children, a sister-in-law. 
Hobbs. New Mexico; Mrs.Ve»- 
ter Reese and children, Odessa; 
and Mr. and Mrs. M a n u e l  
S m i t h ,  P l a i n s .

Four Intermediates of the 
Earth Methodist Church left 
Monday to attend the Plato- 

Distrtct I nt e rmed i a t e

tn
Mr. and Mrs. M. H. been and 

m , Melissa honored then daughter 
Pansy, on her Uth birthday, 
Sunday afternoon, with cake 
and ice cream in their home. 

Others helping Pansy ce le ­
brate her birthday were Mr. 
and Mn. Kenny Hamilton and 
Debate Barton.

view
Camp, at Ccta Canyon, that 
w ill Dc held through Friday.

Those attending are Mark 
Holt, Mike Cowley. Melodic 
Brock. Debra Parish and their 
counselor,Rev.Albert Lindlcy.

Mr. and Mn. F.F.Boxemao 
visited in Amheist, Sunday, 
with his brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Bose man.

Mrs. Roxie V . S e y m o u r

n p -

KilliysRaturn 
Monday Fran
Two Waak Trip
Mr. and Mn. M. E.Kelle; 

returned Monday from two 
weeks vacation in the western 
states. They visited Mrs. Kel­
ley's brother. Mr. and Mrs. 
Haskell Green in Los Angeles, 
California and attended sevee 
al m a j o r  l e a g u e  baseball 
games while there.

Other places of interest they 
enjoyed while in Lo* Angeles 
were Forest Lawn Cemetery 
and they visited the "Queen 
For a Day" and "Seven Keys" 
programs on ABC television.

They viewed the Grand Can­
yon,Walnut Canyon, Petrified 
Forest. Painted Desert and 
the Hoover Dam in Arizona, 
and Las Vegas, Nevada.

is visiting this week with her" 
son. Mi. and Mn. W .A .Cook 
and family in Clyde.

1

I

MYF Members 
Attend Meet 
At Sudan
The MYF Senior Hi Sub Dis­

trict Meeting was held Sunday 
at '3: 30 p.m. In Sudan Meth­
odist Church with several at­
tending Item the local church.

This wd s the fi at Sub District 
meeting iiuce the election of 
officers and a program wui 
presented on " Eotliuilasni and 
Sharing", as a part of the needs 
of the Methodist Youth Fel­
lowship.

Those Jttendtngwere Victor 
Coker, Dwayne Tarish, Lynn 
Hamilton, Bobby and Mari ­
lyn Coker. Karen Jones, Rev. 
Albert Lindlcy Jnd the coun­
selors, Mr. anJ Mrs, W.O, Jones,

The next M Y F  D i s t r i c t  
meet log  Will be held 111 Aug­
ust at Pi a In view.

NOTICE

A. M. 1AYLOR

Springlake Community Building 
Sc u m  O f T iy lo r Reunion
The Springlake Community

Building was the scene of a 
family reunion Sunday, July 

of A . M.
Taylor, H o l l i

lily i 
s.Ok lahoma.

as the family 
'•v ia
.athered tocelebtate his 80th 

birthday.
Mr. Taylor is the father of 

C .O .Gcorgc.Carl and Maned 
Taylor of Earth, and Mis. Juan- 
itaCunningham of Springlake, 
who were all present with 
theit families.

Others attending the ce le­
bration were: Mn. Clifford 
Taylor. Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Taylor and fam ily, Mt. and 
Mrs. JimBridgforth and family, 
and Mrs. Dale Caudill all of 
Lovington, New Mexico; Mi. 
and Mrs.Davy Taylor.Htggcn- 
botham, Jerle Taylor, Earth; 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Taylor.

E-irth; Mn. Hub Weir and Mn. 
Murray Bearden, Wichita Falls; 
Mrs. Bill Stantord and boys of 
Lubbock; Larry Cunningham 
and son. Pampa, Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike S i m m o n s .  Pl ilnvlew; 
Miss June Taylor, Canyon;  
Johnny Conder, 01ton;anilMr. 
and Mrs. L.H.La Duke, Spring- 
lake.

Mr. Taylor was surprised b 
this reunion of his fam ily, 
thinking he was in Earth only 
for the rodeo. He noted that 
all of his family were present 
except two gr a nd c h i Id ten, 
Billy Taylor,  who is in Mnxtcc 
C ity, and Mrs. JoAnn Jeter o f  
National C ity, California.

Mt, Taylor returned to his 
borne in' Hollis late Sunday 
afternoon.

Junior GA Girls 
Attend Baptist 
Campus Last Week

The Junior GA girls from the 
Earth Baptist Church returned 
last week from the Plains Bap­
tist Assembly Camp near Floy- 
dada, where 640 girls regist­
ered for the three day event.

Gtris attending from the local 
church were Regina Cole,An­
nua, Donna and Connie Kcl- I 
ley. Vickie Gregory, Carol I 
Jackson, Sharon Smith. Bev- | 
erly Timms and Kathy Kelley. I 
They were accompanied by | 
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Kelley. , 
..nd Mrs. R S.Cole.

Scout News
Den2 met Monday afternoon 

at the home of their den moth- 
e l, MU. Wilson Lewis. The 
group sold light bulbs west of 
Earth during tne afternoon and 
went s w i m m i n g  later. All 
members were present and v ie  
ttors going with the boys were: 
Job ny Eagle, Danny Boone, 
and Michael Lewis. Den J will 
not meet until after the 15th of 
August.

Tile Cub Scout float won first 
lace in the todeo parade of 
uly 11. The float depicted "Free 

Government Through the Ag. S’ 
from Washington.Gregory Slo- 
ver; through President Kennedy 
steve Randolph; with Uhcle 
sain the central figure on the 
tloat.peirtrayed by Butch Ham­
ilton. Jimmy Littleton and 
Chi is Brock served as flag bea­
rers, on the float. Approxi­
mately 25 boys marched in 
the parade following the float. 
Mrs, Lewis marched with the 
boy

I

Friends of M;. and Mri. James 
Sanderson and sons arc honor­
ing them with a housewarming 
In their new home on High­
way 70, between Earth and 
spti iglike, Tuesday, July 23 
from s til 10 p.m.

Everyone *s invited. A mon­
ey tree w ill be displayed and 
anyone desiring to contribute 
t> iskcJ ia call ot contact 
Velma Baket.

Mrs.Gencva Emery, Recdly. 
California, is v i s i t i n g  her 
mother. Mrs.Mlnme Bulls and 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs.C, P.

| Parish and other relatives this 
week.

A come and go bridal show­
er, honoring Mias Lynda Rose, 
bride-elect of Lee Ro> Kuttall 
w ill be held Friday, July 2C
from ! till 9 p.m. in the home 
of Mrs.A.E. Wheatley, onE. 
Highway 70.

Everyone it invited.

The F r e s h ma n  L e a g u e  
Championship T our n ameni 
begins July 29 In Floydada, 
The winning team in the local 
league w ill play in this tourn­
ament.

A b u d g e t  hearing for the 
Springlake Sclioo: budget, is 
scheduled for August 12, 8:30 
p. m. in the study hall. The 
public is invited.

A ll Cub Scout patents are 
reminded of the pack meeting 
to be held Tuesday evening, 
July 23 at the Springlake Park 
at 7:00, Each family Is to 
bring hot dog fixings tor their 
own fam ily, along with a gal­
lon of punch.

Anyone i n t e r e s t e d  in Cub 
Scouting is also invited to at­
tend the weiner roast.

WANT ED TO BUY--Good used 
Gas Range. A.B. Odom.City 
Drug.

7/18/Ilc
Francis Implement Co. 
Your Ford Tractor Dealer 
Mulcshoe, Texas 

Pd. Adv.

m i i m i r i u  B I.IN D H — ( •>««■•■< f- ib ri.. rind a non »m d »w  
■wo Villon liim iiM tHl la Mind-. «<. urdins to the \-notion  
Blind Inntlfulo S nr rfcair and Mind*, drop and modiurn Mar 
and hra-av sold dom inate the print u-ed hero b i llllaaboth 
Draper

ANNOUNCING!
A

N E W
O P E R A T O R

M rtOvhla Parish
W ho W il l  Be On Hand 
Thursday  and F riday  
And E a r l i e r  In The 
W eek  By Appointment

A

PERM ANENT SPECIALS 
Through August 17
$7. 50 C O L D  W A V E  $6.00  
$10.00 C O L D  W A V E  $8.00  
$15.00 C O L D  W A V E  $12.50 

FOR A P P O I N T M E N T  
C A L L  986-2941

Springlaki Biauty Salei

you rood this 
you will rooliss 
ths effectiveness 
o f an od is  ths
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F L O U R 25 Lb.

K I M B E L L  IN S T A N T

C O F F E E 6 Oz. Jar 59C
C H U C K  W A G O N

B E A N S 15 O z . Can

A IR W IC K  S P R A Y

A ir Freshener 7 O z. Can 
P lus Tax

2 foh2 5 c  

39C
L A N O L IN  P L U S

Hair Spray
P lus Tax 
Reg. 1.09

M E L L 0 R I N E 3 1/2 Galions

5 9 C

*1
F R Y E R S Lb. 25c
K E L L Y

M IL K
E G G S

1 /2 G a l .

3 Do/..

3 9 c

*1
A V O C A D O S Each 1 0 C
P IN K N E Y S

L A R D 39C
M I R A C L E  W H IP

Salad Dressing 39C
B E E F  R O A S T  - 39C
Ham burger M e a t * «*• 89c
B E E F  R IB S n
B A N A N A S 10 c

ADRIAN FOOD
E A R T H ,  T E X A S
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WE ARE PLEASED
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COMPl.CI L'LY DEMOLLS HL1> . .  was this I960 Chevrolet driven by 15 year old Jerry Don Sanders, 
Thursday, around 7 p. m. , when the lelt rear tire blew out, causing Jerry Don to lose control of 
tin automobile. The i .ir tuned o\ct twn t , before coming to rest iii the bar ditch. Je . r ) Don 
accompanied by his cousin, Donnie Ward, Olton, was enroute to the Earth Rodeo when therms* 
hap occurred east of Earth, Doth miraculously escaped serious injury.

Soil Erosion 
A Problem 
To Man
Erosion has been a problem 

to mankind since he began 
tilling the soil. Where erosion 
was controlled, the land is 
still productive, but where it 
was uncontrolled, there are 
sand dunes and rocky slopes, 
with very little or no vegeta­
tion.

The Nomadic tribes of the 
past gave very little thought 
to erosion or care of the land. 
But today, there is no place 
for this type of people, al­
though some people still treat 
the land the same way. Erosion 
control starts with the farmer, 
but it is everybody's problem. 
The farmer is the first to feel 
its effects, and if action is not 
takentocontrol wind and wa­
ter erosion,within a short time 
everyone is effected, whether 
he farms or not.

During a recent irrigation 
conference,several interesting 
points were emphasized, when 
discussing the maximum al­
lowable erosion for an irriga­
tion system. Mott of the soils 
of the High Plains that i an be 
irrigated have a maximum 
annual soil loss, from three to 
five tons per acre. This seems 
to be a large amount when 
thinking in terms of weight. 
However, upon convert ing 
these amounts to inches of soil 
lots, we find that three tons 
of soil lots equals abojt 1/30

of an inch of top soil, and S 
tons equals about 1/50 inch of 
top soil. This amount of top 
soil lots would not be readily 
noticeable to anyone for a 
short period of lim e, but con­
sider the rate of soil develop­
ment, and it may be debatable 
whether the soil could main­
tain its productive potential 
over a long period of time at 
this rate.

Thus, when planning or de­
signing an irrigation system, 
" i f  it has just a whisper of bad 
breath" as the saying goes, 
you may be losing the mree 
to five tons per acre in one 
irrigation, and eroding the 
soil at a rate that is much too 
fast for after all, it is the top 
six inches of our soil that is 
productive, and by removing 
it at the rate of only 1/30 to 
1/50 of an inch per irrigation, 
what will oar grandchildren, 
or great-grandchildren have 
left?They won't have any new 
land left to move to, so if we 
don't take heed to a little 
boy's interpretationofcooscr- 
vation which was. "conserva­
tion is what wc eat, what we 
wear and where we live, and 
if we don't, we won't."

The Lamb County District

Me Alpines Attend 
M oss  Fam ily  
Reunion Sunday

Mr. and Mrs. Skectcr M cAl- 
pine and girls attended the 
Moss Family Reunion at the 
Wayne Eby home in Olton, 
Sunday.

Approximately 106 relatives

Two area youths narrowly 
escaped serious injury,Thurs­
day around 7 p. m. when the 
left rear tire on a 1960 Chev­
rolet, driven by 15 year old 
Jerry Don Sanders, blew out, 
causing him to lose control of 
the automobile, flipping the 
car twice. The car came to 
rest in the bar ditch on the 
left side of the highway and
was completely demolished. 
The accident nappeued ab­
out three miles cast of Earth, 
on Highway 70.

Jerry Don. son of Mr, and 
Mrs. Hershel Sanders, Spring- 
lake, was enroute to the Earth 
Rodeo, accompanied by his 
cousin, 12-year old Donnie 
Ward, Olton.

The lads were taken to the 
Littlefield Hospital by Mrs. 
Sanders and her sister, Mrs.
Glen Patterson, Jerry Don re­
ceived a minor shoulder and 
knee injury, cuts and bruises.

The Ward boy received a 
broken none in three places 
and minor abrasions. The boys 
were admitted to the hospital 
for observation and treatment 
but were released Friday at 
noon.

of the Moss family registered 
for the a 11-day affl 
was spent visiting and taking

ffair, which 
_ and taking 

p i c t u r e s  and reminiscing.
----------------------------------------------|

Mrs.Lola Middleton and Miss
Jo Ann Middleton, Amarillo, 
were Friday dinner guests of | 
Mr. and Mrs. Crill Bulls and 
Glenn. Jo Ann and Glenn Bulls 
w ill be married Saturday in 
Amarillo.

Board of Supervisors say that 
with the presant agriculture I 
programs, every farmer can 
start applying a conservation 
plan to his farm. To get tech- | 
nical help in planning and j 
laying out a conservation plan 
for their farm, they should I 
contact the Soil Conservation | 
Service personnel, and they 
will sec that the technical 
assistance is given.

Card if Thaiki
Our thanks to each one of 

the many friends whose loving 
e x p r e s s i o n s  o f  sympathy 
helped us so much during the 
loss of our loved one. For 
those who brought food, sent 
flowers and for all the kind­
nesses that were expressed by 
all.

The Family of O. H.Cooper

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Cody were 
in Iowa Park Saturday to visit 
Mr.Cody's sister.

Mr. and Mrs. Vern S teffeyjt. 
and baby daughter, San Fran­
cisco, California, Mrs.Claud 
Haney, Tipton, Oklahoma, 
Mrs. L. A .George, Jim Smith, 
Mrs.Vern Steffcy.Sr.and Jane 
of Olton were Thursday dinner 
guests of the John Laings.

Party Um...
Mrs.Vemie Bearden and Ann

were in Littlefield and visited 
George Choate and H « r * b a l  
Sanders, patients in the Little­
field Hospital. Mr. Bearden 
visited them Sunday afternoon.

Jimmie Mann is visiting this 
week with his aunt, Mrs.  
Thelma Gable and family in 
Lubbock,and his grandmother, 
Mrs. O. L. Mann, Idalou,

Mrs. Bill Mann has been in 
Abilene the past few days 
with her daughter. Patti, while 
she completes semester exams. 
They returned home Wednes­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Boone, Sa­
lem,Oregon,arrived Saturday 
to visit his mother,Mrs. Mat- 
tie Boone, of Springlake. Mrs.
Boone is a sister of Chubby
Dent, of Earth.

Mrs. O. L. Mann, Ida lou. vis­
ited her son, Mr. and Mrs.Bill 
Mann and children, the first 
of last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Sanders 
were in Portales.New Mexico
Saturday, and visited their 
son. Mr. and Mrs.Sandy San­
ders, and De Lynn.

Beverly Prather is visiting 
this week with her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Sandy Sanders and 
DcLynn in Portales, N. M.

Mr. and Mrs. Scott Faulken- 
berry and children. Floydada, 
spent Thursday n i gh t and 
Friday with the Crill Bulls' and 
attended the rodeo Thursday 
night. Mrs. Faulkenberry atten­
ded the bridal shower lor Mias 
Jo Ann Middleton, bride- elect 
of Glenn Bulls, Friday after­
noon in the J. L.Hinson home, 
before returning home.

Mr.and Mrs. John Laing were 
in Ruidoso, New Mexico over 
the weekend.

'̂ 1

3.59
3.83
4.28

THEY'RE ALWAYS IN STYLE I
» m -  *••

B L U E  D E N I M
Sizes 0 to 12 
Sizes 27 to 29 
Sizes 30 to 38

L E V I  C A L I F O R N I A N S

•Black 
•Green 

•  White

Boys Sizes 3.98 
Mens Sizes 4.58

T i/ llt & t f iW  j8r(jy.
E A R T H . T E X A S

Two Youths Eseopo Sorious Injury 
In Car Mishap Thursday

flcasaiit Yalliy News..
By SHERYL STE/ENS

Mist Juanita St.Clair, bridt- 
eleci of Lee Myers,Hereford, 
was honored w i t h  a linen 
shower Tuesday afternoon In 
the Pleasant Valley Commun­
ity Building. The hostesses 
were Mms. Ruth Lackey. Lena 
Kenney.Peggy Bickel, Hattie 
Bickel, Alma Turner, A lice 
Kclton, Opal Rulhardt, Clau- 
dine Embry, Katie Koubtnek, 
Margaret Dots, Lenore Wells, 
and Vickie Hendricks. A pink 
artificial flower arrangenu m 
centered the table, which was 
covered with a lace cloth over 
pink. The hosutzet* gift was 
a colonial bedspread. Vows 
will be made by the couple 
August 2 in th e  Muleshoe 
Church of Christ.

Mr. and Mrs. G. M. Wells of 
Lubbock spent a few days this 
week in tne home of Mr. and 
Mrs. C. E. Wells.

The Pleasant Val ley Social 
Club met in the Community 
Center Thursday night with 
eight members and one guest 
present. M e m b e r s  present, 
were; Mae Parker,claudiile 
Embry, Edith St.Clair, Jum- 
ita Galyon, Betty Jackson,Belli 
Sklpworth, Ruth Lackey and 
the hostess, Lenofe Wells. The 
guest was Leah Mae Jones of 
Muleshoe. T h e  m e m b e r s  
dressed western for this meet­
ing. Roll call was answered 
with a joke. Afier completion 
of the business session, home 
made icc cream and cookies 
were served by the hostess.

The next meeting will be lie!
The next meeting will be­

held July 24, in the commun­
ity center, with Ruth Lackey 
as hostess.

Mrs. E. K. Angcley visited 
with friends and relatives this

week m Texas and Oklahoma.
Visitiug Saturday in the S. L. 

Jackson home was their son, 
and family, Mr, and Mrs,Joe 
Don Jackson and Jo Donna.

Mr, and Mrs, Elmo Stevens 
and Ricky Std Mr. and Mis. 
Gene Wtumiingham and Don 
spent the weekend inCarlsbad, 
N. M. They enjoyed a tour of 
Carlsbad Caverns while they 
were there,

Monday night, Mr.and Mrs, 
W.J. Meeks Tiad dinner In the 
home of his parents, Mr.and 
Mrs. L. F. Meeks, Sudan,

Mr. and Mrs. S. L.Jackson 
spent Sunday in Plainview 
visiting their graiiddaugler, 
Mr.and Mrs. Bill Goync. Also 
their gieat-granddaughter was 
in P! .. Mr. and Mrs.
Penny Culp of Midland.

Party Lina
Mr. and Mrs,Ed Blair returned 

their grandsons Mike and Tom 
Blair of Ervin, home Sunday 
after the two boys lud spent 
the past six weeks visiting 
their grandparents, here.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Lewis 
spent the weekend in Amarillo 
visiting ihcir daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Donald sandcl and 
children.

Mrs. Henry Lewis took her 
mother,Mrs.BelleGoldston to 
Lubbock Monday to visit Mrs. 
Goldstorft cousin,Mr.and Mrs. 
Henry Green lot several days.

Warner Dodson and daughter 
Kay, Porrtngton, W y o m i n g  
spent the weekend with his 
aunt, Mr, and Mrs. W .H. Par­
ish.

Visiting with M rs.A,C .Bar­
ton Sunday afternoon were Mrs. 
£ou Wilson, Mrs. Ann Hodge, 
Mrs. Lena Hite and Mrs. Elsie 
Hawkins.

Two year old Kent Foster of 
Lubbock it spending the week 
with his great-grandparenu. 
Mi. and Mrs.B. J.Btockette.

Marvin Brown is visiting in 
Lockney with his daughters and 
families, the C lifford Hollums, 
and Tommy Scarberty's.

Mr.and Mrsjoel Nowlan and 
children, Muleshoe, visited 
Mrs.Marvm Brown,Jackie and 
Leslie, Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. Fred Clayton was in 
Muleshoe Monday morning on 
business.

Mrs. Alvin Lee and children 
ate visiting her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs.Crill Built, tint week.

Mrs.W. F. W111 ta mson. Olton, 
was a Tuesday dinner guest of 
Mr.and Mrs.Lawrence Sloan.

Francis Implement Co.
Your Ford Tractor Dealer
Muleshoe, Texas 

Pd.Adv.

CHARMGL0W 300
H i s  swing open door
for easy cleaning

f

CHARMGL0W 100
Built of durable copper 
finished m black

I  MODERN 
LIGHT TOR 

LIVING
3 models

Priced from$4985
Nothing down 
2 years to pay

CHARMGLOW 400

Available horn employees of
P I O N E E R  N A T U R A L  G A S  C O M P A N Y

R E Q U E S T S  FOR  
U R T H E R  IN F O R M A T IO N  
Y M A I L  OR T E L E P H O N E  

I L L  B E  A N S W E R E D
1 M E D I A T E L Y ............

C O N T A C T

B R U C E  F IN K  
G U S  P A R IS H  

o r
T E D  W A R W I C K

Yez, We a re  P le a s e d  Indeed 
To Have Had Such T rem endous  

Interest Shown in O ur  New Pum p. . 
Thanks to A ll  Who Stopped And 

Looked the Pum p  O ve r  and Inquired  
About its Many Outstanding Featu res ,

KMP Pump Go.,
E A R T H ,  T E X A S  P H O N E  257-2061



incuts. Farmers have 16 days 
from the date of the county 
committee's decision to ap­
peal to the ASC State Com­
mittee if they do not agree 
with the county committee 
decision.
— H e a r i n g s  on appeaIs of 
farm normal yields will not 
be s c h e d u l e d  becausethe 
yield figures will not ne appli­
cable for 1964, Where produ­
cers wish to furnish proven 
yield data, such data w ill be 
filed in the county office with 
other records of that farm.

USDA R iv iiw t 
Wheat P ro irm

fitted jacket and white acces­
sories. She carried a bouquet 
of white carnations.

Best man was Micky Wag­
goner, S u n n y s i d e . Claburn 
Stewart was groomsman. Lee 
Oden brother of the bride, and 
DOM Layman were ushers.

Following the ceremony a 
reception was held in Fellow­
ship Hall at the church. A 
three tiered wedding cake, 
punch and nuts was served the 
guests. Wedding gifts were 
displayed at the reception.

For a wedding trip to Color­
ado, the bride wore a lovely 
white knit suit,complimented 
by white accessories and a 
white orchid.

Upon returning home Mrs. 
Johnson will remain in Earth, 
with her parents, and work at 
Pioneer Natural Gas Company, 
where she is employed. The 
groom will report back to his 
navy base, in Seattle, Wash­
ington. for overseas duty. He 
has been in the Navy 2 years.

The bride is a 1963 graduate 
of Spnnglake Hi gh School. The 
groom attended Hart schools.

Pg. 4-The Earth News-Sun, Thursday, July 18,1963

The wheat program for 1964 
under provisions of existing 
law are reviewed by the U,S, 
Department of Agriculture in 
response toquestions that have 
arisen since the referendum 
o f May 21.

Price support will be availa­
ble to producers who plant 
within the acreage allotments 
which have been established 
for tlie 1964 whe it crop. A llo t­
ments were announced ill Ap­
ril. The national average sup­
port price will be 5<W> of par­
ity. (The present parity price 
is $'J. >1 per bushel.) There 
will be no marketing quota 
penalties for planting in e x ­
cess ot acreage allotments. 
However, the statute provides 
that producers who overplani 
their allotments will  receive
history" credit only in the 

amount of their allotments.
Farmers who have Conserva­

tion Reserve contracts agreed 
to plant within their farm ac­
reage a l l o t m e n t s ,  and this 
means that the 1964 Conserva­
tion Reserve payment for the 
turm ib dependent on compli­
ance with the wheat acreage 
allotment.

Wheat that was grown in ex­
cess of marketing quotas in 
the past will  be subject to the 
original penalty provisions un­
til July 1, 1964. After that 
date.storcdexcesswhe.it may 
be released without penalty. 
The amount of such wheat CD 
storage on farms and in ware­
houses is estimated at46 m il­
lion bushels. This could be 
increased from the 1963 crop, 
which is subject to marketing 
q u o t a s ,  and excess wheat 
from this crop may be stored 
by the producer to avoid pay­
ment of the penalty. On the 
other hand, underplanting or 
underproduction of 1963-crop 
wheat could result in the early 
release of excess wheat that 
had been stored from previous 
crops to avoid payment of 
penalty.

Other items of interest to 
growers in administration of 
the 1964 wheat program with­
out marketing quotas include: 
— ASC county committees 
wif! hear all appeals of 1964 
farm wheat acreage allot-

Wedding vows lorMiss Linda 
Oden ana Keith Johnson were 
read Friday, July 12 at 7 p.m. 
in the Sunny s i d e  Baptist  
Church.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Houston Oden, 
Earth, and Mr, nd Mrs.C.J. 
Johnson, Dimmitt.

Rev. Murlv Durham, pastor 
officiated at the double ring 
ceremony, before an archway 
of greenery .topped with white 
wedding bells, flanked by 
baskets of white and gold 
mums.

Mrs. Marie Slover sang O, 
Promise M e” and "The Wed­
ding Prayer',' accompanied by 
Miss Janice Cowley, both of 
Earth.

The bride, given in marriage 
by her father, wort a floor 
length gown of cliaiittlly lace 
over satin, designed with a

C let'A
fakin'

r IIHH ItKtWSTKR
OmUlu«r  A; r/if or, _

M t r r u r y  O * th o 0rk t  H

F IN D  'E M .  T H E N  F I S H
hihm 's  Ash I*

the tricky  pint
T ill*  o b sn  tn linn  w III Ink*- nil 

more Importance (luring the Hum­
mer m onth* m* many thoii*Hml* 
of vHcatlonlnK fishermen try 
their luck on strange wntarn. 
How mu cesaflllly the obstacle of 
finding A *h I* surm ounted often 
determ ine* the trip 's  sucre s*

T o  m ake  yo u r  Job of e xp lo r in g  
the dep th s e a sie r  and  qu icke r, 
M e rc u ry  ou tb oa rd  f ish in g  e x ­
pe rts  ou tline  je -e ra l m ethode 
that w ill be helpful.

Y our best bet. they nay I* to 
hire H guide or enlist the aid of 
u friend who known the waters 
If  he cannot be with you each 
day. utilise hi* time In show lna 
you a variety of "hot spots ” K ish  
each only briefly, then move to 
another suggested location The  
know ledge thus gained w ill be 
Invaluable on succeeding days.

W hen exploring alone, keep 
your outboard runn ing  You 'll 
have to cover a lot of territory 
In order to pinpoint the place* 
favored by local ang le r* with 
years of experience.

You can either troll or drift 
slow ly while casting shoreline 
stretches and point* of land Hint 
appear p rom ising The  old trick 
of m oving In reverse cuts speed 
to a minimum, a llow ing you to 
m aneuver easily w ith one hand 
nnd cast with the other. It a lso 
perm its you to m slnta ln  position 
In a wind

A lw ays a sk  plenty of questions 
. . at gas stations, tackle stores, 

m arinas Resort operators, whose 
businesses often depend upon 
A sh ing  success of guests are 
usually top sourres

dengued with a
I r r ig a t io n  Belt  
League A ll  Stars  
P lay  H e re fo rd

The Irrigation Belt League 
A ll Stan begin play Monday 
night, when they play Here­
ford. there, at 8 p.m. inthe 
first game of the state play­
off.

The local team 1s made up 
ol team members from Earth- 
Sptmglake, Olton and Sudan 
Pony League.

A ll star members include 
Doug Messer, Logan Armstrong, 
Jim Stockstill, Harlyn Gallo­
way, Donald Huff, Mark Holt, 
Danny Kelley and Mike Dent, 
on the Earth-Spnnglake team. 
Ronuie H ill, Rob in D a v i t ,  
W i l l i a m  Matthews,  Gary 
Gatewood and Michael Chit- 
holm, Sudan; and Robert Turn­
er and Garland Huguley.of OK 
ton.

The boys wiU be managed 
by Shony Kelley and coached 
by Billy Hanna

NOW RECLIVE: 0,00 CREDIT DISCOUNT 
ON A L L  NEW ACCOUNTS OPENED IN THE 
AMOUNT OF SJ00.00 OR MORE.................

HOW BIG CAN THEY GROW’ . it the queqiun one might i s ! , s the' view ihi-hugi '*.! Lb 
watermelon, given to Rev. M.B.Baldwin last week at Texarkana . win e lie * Ei v  ie 
vival there.

Sudan.
I f  the* local team wini Mon­

day night, they will play 
Tuesday night in Hereford.If 
they lose, they play Wednet- 
day night. There wilt be a 
two game elimination, win­
ning team will  go to Tulsa, 
Oklahoma, to play.

The local A ll Star Team 
played Littlefield Sunday, at 
^:30 p.m. Littlefield beat by 
a score of 9 to 2. Losing pitch­
er was Jim Stockstill.

L oca l  Pee  W ee  
Tournam ent Starts  
M onday , July 2Z

Mrs. StellaCearlcy and Ode- 
liaGilmore,Silverton, former 
residents, were in Earth Mon­
day.

Built by mission priests more 
than 200 years ago, a ditch ill 
San Antonio, u .till used for 
irrigation.

England's Channel Islands 
consist of Jersey, Guernsey, 
A l d e r n e y .  Sark, Hern and 
Jethou.

Mrs. Vern Steffcy and Jane, 
Mrs. L. A.George, Olton, vis- 
isted Thursday night in the 
George Luiug nome.

Francis Implement do. 
Muleshoe, Texas 
Your Ford Tractor Dealer

The four Pee Wee teams 
w ill have a tournament start­
ing Monday July 22.

On Monday, tne Angels and 
the Dodgers will clash on the 
local field at 5:30 p.m .Tues­
day. the Braves and Indians 
meet at 8 p. m.

Winners of these two games 
w ill play each other Thursday 
at 8 p. m. The losers w ill play 
Friday night at 8.

Sava 842 19 regularly $279 M ALL FROSTLESS Refrigerator- 
Frterer no more digging, prying or defrosting 
Frostless Refrigerator Section has 2 full-width shelves plus glass 
crisper cover for 17.3 sq. ft of shelf space Adjustable top shelf 
Bonus door has 3 shelves one for y,-gal. cartons and tall bottlss. 
Covsrsd buttsr-chssss keepsr and rsmovabie sgg racks 
Frosttoss Freeter Section has room for 120 lbs of frotsn food. 
Including 12 packages on ths bonus door 2 ics trays SORGHUM M IDGE 

R EP O R TED  i l  
LAM B  C OUNTY

Standings

Team
‘‘M otorists are b it  helps in 

the fitn e ss  p ro g ram s. T he y  
keep pedestrians in good run-

Dodgers
Braves
Indiansi n lng  condition.

W E  T A K E  P R ID E  IN O F F E R IN G  Y O U  OUR  M A N Y  S E R V IC E S

*  B A N K IN G  BY  C A R
*  T R A V E L E R S  C H E C K S
*  S A F E T Y  D E P O S IT  B O X E S
*  B A N K IN G  B Y  M A I L

Sofe W o y to Pay

AS YOU CAN SEE, YOUR JUDGMENT IS AS GOOD AS O U R S  IN  D E T E R M IN IN G  
WHETHER YOU SHOU ED SPRAY FOR MIDGE. IF  WE C A N  H E L P ,  W E  W I L L  
BE GLAD  TO DO SO, AND IF YOU SPRAY, WE ASK  Y O U  FOR Y O U R  B U S IN E S S  
W E HAVE HI BOYS AND PLANES TO DO THE S P R A Y IN G ,  A N D  T H E  R E C O  M -  
MENDED CHEMICALS FOR THE JOB.

IF  Y O U  H A V E  ANY QUESTIONS THAT W E M A Y  H E L P  Y O U  W IT H ,  P  L E  A S  E ,  
C O M E  IN A N D  SEE US. THIS C O U L D  B E  C H E A P  IN S U R A N C E  O N  YOUR  G R A IN  
C R O P .  . . .

S P R IN G  L A K E  
S U N N Y S ID E

E A R T H
D O D D

FROSUESS
FREEZER
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Coker and Dawson Attond Public Strvico Workshop on Farm Electrification
Two local lads. Bob Coker 

and Ken Dawson, of Sptinglake 
were among the %  High Plains 
members oT the Future Farm­
ers from Panhandle, South 
Plains, New Mexico and Ok­
lahoma who were guests of the 
Southwestern Public Service 
Company, July 9-10-11,at the 
first Workshop on farm elect­
rification for FFA members 
aver held.

The three day conference

was held at the Episcopal
Church Conference Center, 
uotth of Amarillo.

Five major courses were of* 
fered during the three days, 
covering farm wiring, electric 
controls, farm motors, lighting 
applications and heating.

The FFA member adjudged 
outstanding in each of these 
subjects were awarded a trip 
to the National FFA Conven­
tion, which will be held in

ANNOUNCING!
The Pu rch ase  of

The Ice Machine And

Snow Cone B usiness

In Earth

By

Nr. and Mrs. James Lackey
W E I N V I T E  YO U  

TO

Drop By
FOR D E L IC IO U S

S N O W  C O N E S
A N D  FO R  A L L  YOUR

IC E

BOB COKER AND KF'N DAWSON OF SPIUNGLAKE attended Fart Electrification Conference 
for FFA members held July B. 10 sad II 
western Public Service Company,

KansasCity,October8-ll. T '». 
award winners were:

Gary Brachcr, L kc Arthur. 
New Mexico,Controls; Walter 
Laslcy, Stratford, Texas, 1 leas­
ing. Loney Ashcraft, Roswell, 
New Mexico, Motors; Stive 
Glenn, Clovis, New Mexico, 
Lighting; and Frank Martinez, 
Ralls, Texas, Wiring.

Sam Thomas, Agricultural 
Development Manager for tin 
Southwestern Public Scr\ ice 
Company, was director of the 
Workshop, assisted by T o m  
Field,PlJlIlVlew. The staff ot 
instructors were Price Hobgood, 
head of agricultural engineer­
ing at Texas A&M; W .L .M c- 
Cune, rural electrification 
research specialist from C ol­
lege Station; and Bob J.iska, 
co-ordinate of specialist pro­
gram, Division of Vocational 
Agriculture, Texas Education 
Agency; aud tile following 
named men are with South­
western Public Service Com­
pany, Bub Laird, Plains 
Tom Lynn, Amarillo; Roger 
Owen,Amarillo; Richard Rid- 
wine, Clovis and Wayne Jen­
nings of Roswell.

Party Line
Mr. and Mrs. A .L. Allen ' 

Quinlan, visited Iasi week in 
Earth with Ins mother.Mrs.La 
Al len, and his sister, Mrs, 
Baacl Glasscock and family. 
They returned home Friday, 
accompanied by his mother, 
who will visit several days in 
the Allen home.

Mrs, Ed'‘J Worley, kermlt, 
and Mrs. NolaCarter ofVernor. 
arc visiting in the home of III 
tile ir sister,Mr. .Uiel Mrs. W. 11. I 
Pansli, tins week. 11

Klrs.Neathy Whit ford mdlier

Mrs. Kell M iller.
Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Pierce and 

children of Amaril lo spent 
Saturday night with her rnoth 
er, Mrs. Elsie Hawkins, and
attended the rodeo.__________

k j lin alarm ,r Co,
Your Ford Tractor Dealer 
Muleshoe, l exas 

PJ.Adv.

.

Outlook fo r '63 
form Economic
The p-ice-con squeeze on 

farmers may tighten some 
during 1963 due to larger sup­
plies and lower average prices 
of farm orocucts along with 
higher production costs, says 
John McHaney, e c o n o m  ist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service.

The larger output expected 
in 1963 will raise the gross 
f irm income but tins increase 
will  be offset by higher prices 
paid by farmers,he elaborates. 
Economic activity of the na­
tion as a whole increased dur­
ing the early part of 1963 and 
will probably continue to ad­
vance lilt rest of the year 
though at a slower rate.

Exports of farm products in 
the calendar year 1963 will 
probably total about the same 
as the record shipments iu 1961 
and 1962. says McHaney. Food 
fats and oils and dairy product 
exports will probably increase 
while wheat and cotton levels 
w ill remain near the 196.’ f ig­
ure. Poultry and feed gram 
exports arc expected to be 
lower than in 1962, the econ­
omist adds.

Looking at prospects for the 
rest of the year, fed cattle 
prices are expected to improve 
somewhat due to a seasonal

Mr,and Mrsjamcs Glasscock 
of Bledsoe, spent Saturday 
night and Sunday with his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. LA .G lass­
cock.

The Earth News-Sun, Thursday, July 18,1963-Pg,5

2 18  Gins Apply Fo r 
“ Mike”  Testing Service

in 
Cotton

More than ha If of the gins in 
this territory have applied for 
tile U. S. Department of A g ­
riculture's new  nicronaire 
cotton testing service.

This was announced toda 
by W, K. Palmer, Officer 
Charge, L u b b o c k  
Classing Office.

In past years, these 21 b gins 
have ginned about 49 percent 
of the cotton procuced in this 
area, accordiug to Mr, Pal­
mer.

"This means that most farm- 
eis in tins territory will have 
an additional quality meas­
urement--the "mike test--to 
use in selling their cotton for 
the best possible price."

Several gins in each cotton 
producing county in this urea
have made application for the 
"m ike" testing.

Cost for the "ini'  tw s 
~<t per sample. Ginnerswtll be 
billed for tins service. They 
may include it with the cost 
of ginning, as a separate fee 
or as an additional customer 
service.

Mr. aud Mrs. Gerald Inglis 
and girls visited her sister,Mr. 
and Mis. Darrei Nickels and 
children, in Littlefield. Sun­
day.

Party Line
Mrs,Pearl Nelson,Bakersfield,

C a l i f o r n i a ,  visited m the 
homes of Mrs.Gerald Inglis and 
Mrs. Nat Bearden, Monday.

Sunday visitors in the Bill 
Freeman home were lus par­
ents, the J. W. Freemans and 
his brothers, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Freeman and i hildren, Mr,and 
Mrs. Grady Freeman and ch il­
dren, all of Kress.

Mrs. Travis Jaquess was in 
Lubbock Monday on business.

Mrs.Vester Reese and child­
ren. Odessa, and Mrs.Juanita 
Kasingcr and children, Hobbs, 
New Mexico, visited Sunday 
night through Tuesday witri 
Mr. and Mrs.George K. singer 
and the M. R. Burton's.

Mrs. M.G. Williams, Archer 
City, visited Mrs.George Ka- 
singer and Mrs. L. O. Liglitfoot 
Monday morning.

Mrs. Claud Haiiey, Tipton, 
Oklahoma, v i s i t e d  several 
days last week with her broth- 
er, Mr, and Mrs, John La mg.

daughter, .Mrs, Pearl Nelson ' 
Bake r s  
are visitiu

f i e l d  . Ca l i f o rm 
tug this week with Mr. 

and Mrs. W. II. Patidi. Mrs. 
Williford aud Mrs. Parish an 
listers,

Diana Glasscock accompan­
ied Mrs. Floy J C raw fora 1 
Floydell ro San Vntonio rec ­
ently. where they visited Mrs. 
Crawford's daughter, M:. aid

Welcome to hath

Announcing. . . v
Vs

P I
]
k L

MR. AND MRS. BFRT WEIL AND FAMILY

■ . »• .* \  «
' '  ‘

Welcome to  Earth  to  M r. and Mrs. Bert Weil 
who moved here recently from  Hale Center.
Mr. Weil is shop forem an for Brownd - White
Equipment Co

Prior to coming to Earth, Mr. Weil  was employed at the Center Implement Company lor three years.
Mr. and Mrs. Weil  art parents of two children, Dc Vorah. 8. i third grade student, tid Donnie Bert, 
age i. They arc members of the Baptist Church.

The Following Merchants Extend Tlieir Welcome To All Newcomen .

C O N S T R U C T IO N  H A S  B E G U N  O N  T H E  N EW

Grain Handling Equipment Facilities
The EARTH NEWS - SUN

EARTH, TEXAS

EARTH GULF STATION
A T EARTH, TEXAS

A To I  Gram and 
Ferttfzar, Inc.

W E  P L A N  TO G IV E  T H E  B E S T  S E R V IC E  P O S S IB L E  
FOR  H A N D L IN G  YO UR  G R A I N . . . .

EARTH CLEANERS
EARTH, TEXA8

SUNSET DRIVE - IN THEATRE
EARTH. TEXA8

BARTON - WATSON, INC.
EARTH, TEXAS

CITIZENS STATE BANK
MEMBER F. D I C

EARTH OIL and GAS CO., INC.
M H. BEEN, Manager

EVANS INSURANCE
EARTH, TEXAS —  Phone 257-3461

PATTERSON BROS. GROCERY GIFT AND FABRIC SHOP
EARTH, TEXAS EARTH, TEXA8

WOLVERINE DRIVE IN
EARTH. TEXAS

PIGGLY WIGGLY
EARTH, TEXAS

E A R T H ,  T E X A S



Pg. 6«The Earth News-Sun,Thursday, July 18,1963

Texas Agriculturists 
Heavy Spenders
Texas fanners and ranchmen 

are continuing to contribute 
mightily to the general econ­
omic welfare of their state 
and nation. They are big 
spenders on mam street, points 
out John McHaney, extension 
economist, despite the fact 
their numbers are decreasing. 
Their purchases of production 
and consumer items continue 
to increase and are a determ­
ining factor in many counties 
for business conditions.

On an annual basis, Texas 
farmers and ranchmen spend 
about $1,848,000,000 in Cliotr 
opeiatioui. Included is 449 
million dollars for hired labor 
and machine hire; 398 million 
for seed,feed, plants, fertili­
zer and lime; 310 million foi 
livestock bought and livestock 
expenses; 301 million for ma­
chinery purchased and lor re­
pairs and maintenance; 119 
million for petroleum products; 
67 million for construction 
materials. 57 million for mis­
cellaneous crop ex pcuscs and 
147 million for other expenses 
including interest aud insuran­
ce.

Emphasizing the importance 
ul agricultural spending. Me- 
Haney points out that three- 
fourths of all the manufactur­
ing in tiie state is confined to 
about six percent of the comi­
ties. Also,that in 208 counties 
more workers are hired on 
tar ms and r a nches  that 
in manufacturing and in 215 
counties the value j f  agricult­
ural production exceeds that 
of manufacturing.

Many businesses m our towns 
and cities arc existing wholly 
or in part on agri-business and 
their employees spend their 
money for various consumer 
items which 0ivc a multiplying 
effect on maiu street.

Farmers and ranchmen. Me- 
Haney explains, because of the 
cost-price squeeze and the 
need for more efficient pro­
duction, have used maehmes 
to re p l a c e  high eost 1 abor 
whenever possible. Tractors, 
trucks, combines,cjuom pick- 
lug machines and stnppen, 
corn pickers, pick-up hay ba­
lers,home freezers, te letsionc i 
electrical equipment of many 
kinds, nnlkmg machines and 
much other machinery have 
become standard equipmeut 
during the past 20 years. Costs 
of these and other items, along 
with labor, have kept maiu

street speuding ou the lucre use. 
McHaney says, don't take ag­
riculture fo r  g r a n t e d  fot a 
means too much to the total 
economy of Texas.

Party Line,• • •

Thursday and Friday nighi 
guests iutne H.S.Sanden home 
were Mrs. Lola Middleton and 
Jo Ann Middleton, Amarillo.

Mrs. Ted Warwick and sous, 
Lubbock, spent Thursday night 
and Friday in Earth with Mr, 
Warwick, who is employed by 
K.M.P.PumpCo.The Warwnks 
plan to move to Earth m the 
ucar future.

Denny Parish v isiled Saturday 
afternoon and Sunday aftenioon 
m Oltou.with Ronnie Wi l l iam- 
sou.

Mr. and Mrs. M .G . Williams, 
Archer C ity, visited Sunday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs.C. 
S, Armstrong.

Mrs. Polly Middleton visited 
ill Oil on Friday with Mrs. W. r. 
Williamsou.

Mr. and Mrs. Hugh Beasley 
and Laura Faye Kauur.Bisbee 
Arizona, visited the Bill Beat- 
ley'sSunday and Monday, and 
attended the O. H.Cooper fu- 
ueral in Springlakc Monday 
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs.Cuy Kelley were 
in Lubbock Sunday and visited 
his sitter, the Earl M iller's and 
his mother, Mrs. Lura Kelley.

Mr. and Mrs. L. E. Sloan. 
Stephen Mann and the M. R. 
Phillips' were Sunday dinner 
guests m theCarlisBms home.

Mr. and Mrs. James Passons. 
N e wc a s t l e .  Wyoming, left 
Monday for home, after spen­
ding the past week with Mrs. 
Pattons' parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
R .C .H00UO and her usur.M '. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Sloan.They 
will visit relatives in Kies- 
Borger and Pcrryton. entoute 
home.

Francis Implement Co. 
Mulcshoe. Texas 
Your Ford Tractor Dealer 

Pd. A d v .

Lowest

P R IC E S  G O O D  A T  E A R T H  S T O R E  O N L Y  
J U L Y  1 8 th  th ru  J U L Y  2 4 th

DOUBLE S .& H . G R E E N ^  w e  C I V  *  * 
STAM PS EVER Y 

TU ES D AY &
W EDNESDAY 

WITH ’ 2S° PURCHASE
W

O P E N  D A I L Y  
8 A .M .- 9  P .M .

CLOSED SUNDAY

M & B M .............G R E E N  
S T A M P S

A S S O R T E D  F L A V O R S

P K G S .

C L O S E - O U T  S P E C I A L

G O L D E N ' C E N T R A L  A M E R IC A N

BANANAS L B .

THOMPSON SEEDLESS

G R A P ES L B .

B U T L E R ’S

Cantaloupes L B .

29*
5*

AV O C AD O S  3 25*  
TO M A TO ES  25*
SWLF I 'S  PREMIUM

J i .b . $959
L E A N  F R E S H -G R O U N D

Biscuits | |  ^ 1
S H U R F IN E

^ jj^ C A N S

G A L L O N  S H U R F IN E  W HI T E  D I S T I L L E D

Vinegar G A L .  JUG 4»
I M P E R I A L

SUGAR 5 L B .  B A G 5*
H E A V Y - D U T Y

Reynolds Wrap 73 £ V A L U E »
C U D A H Y 'S

PURE LARD 3 L B .  C A R T O N 39*
HAST - 2*
CHECK OUR EVERYDAY LOW PRICES! 1
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Texas Nas 
Both Cattle

The Highway Patrol iuvesti-

§ated eight rural traffic acci- 
enti In Lamb County during 

the month of June according 
toSergeam U.5.Lawson, f iu o l  
bupervnor of this area.

These wrecks accounted for 
four persons Injured and an es­
timated property damage in 
the amount of $8,560.00.

DM Sergeant stated that this 
brings the total for the year, 
thus far in Lamb County to 44 
accidents that claimed four 
lives, injured 37 people and 
caused property damage of 
$40,044. 00.

For a comparison, the Patrol 
Supervisor pointed to accidents 
m this County for the first six 
months of 1962 that accounted 
for three deaths, 54 injuries 
and p r o p e r t y  d a m a g e  of 
$60,360. 00.

" Prior to July 1, there had 
been a total of 941 fatal acci­
dents in Texas,” Sergeant Law- 
son states, "that took the lives 
of 1136 persons. ”

As the year is over half gone 
there arc- definite indications 
that traffic deaths will hit an 
all-tim e high in 1963. Motor- 
cidcs at this time are over 100

more than at the same time 
last year, " the Sergeant said, 
" I f  we continue to take lives 
at the present rate, 1963 will 
become the most deadly year 
in Texas history for traffic fa­
talities. Considering the trend 
of incteased accidents and 
casualties, we have every 
reason to expect that traf f ic 
deaths will exceed the prev­
ious all-tim e high m Texas 
of 2611 in 1956.”

Only 191 more deaths in 1963 
than in 1962 w ill make a total 
of 2612 deaths, an all-time 
high and an increase for the 
year of eight percent over *62. 
beatlis this year have consist- 
teillly been in excess of eight 
percent of 1962.

The Patrol Sergeant stated, 
"This is not just a probability 
it is fairly certain to become 
a reality unless the motoring
public becomes more thought­
ful in regard to complying 
with all laws which would 
break the trend. ”

Francis Implement Co 
Your Ford Tractor Dealer 
Muleshoc, Texas 

Pd.Adv.

Deep Disk Plowing Improves 
Water-Intake Of Plains Soils

The water-intake rate of 12 
million acres of slowly perm­
eable Southern Great Plains 
Soils can be almost doubled
by deep tillage with a disk 
plow, says the U.S. Depart­
ment of Agriculture.

Experiments conducted by 
the USDA and the Texas A g ­
ricultural Experiment Station 
found that plots disk-plowed 
24 inches deep had a water-ep ha
intake rate 1.9  times that of 
check plots not deep plowed.

Pullman and associated soils 
which p r e d o m i n a t e  on the 
Plains, are moderately perm­
eable clay loam underlain by 
16 to 20 inches of dense com- 
pctc lay ,says  the Department. 
Immediately after irrigation 
or rainfall, water enters these 
soi Is at 0.5 to 1.0 inch pel 
hour, but the water- intake 
declines to less than 0. 1 inch 
per hour after four hours and 
to 0.05 inch per hour within 
ten hours.

To determine the effective­
ness of deep tillage, moisture 
measurements were taken 20

minutes following au irrig* 
turn. Moisture was distributed 
to a depth of six feet in the 
disk-plowed soils but entered 
the check plot to a depth o f  
only one foot.

Deep tillage appeared to 
have a permanent effect on 
the soil permeability, say the 
scientists. Three years after 
the disk-plowing the water- 
intake was undiimnished.they 
report.

This improvement of the 
| soil was a t t r i b u t e d  to the 

mixing of more permeable 
ones. The USDA says that the 
mixing of the less fertile soil 
with tne fertile top soil w ill 
probably not reduce the pro­
ductive capacity of the land 
if  moisture and soil fertility 
remain adequate.

Mr. and Mrs.C.O. McAlpine 
of Bandera, Mrs.Faye Holde- 
man, San Antonio, Mr. and 
Mrs. E.E. McAlpine and child­
ren, Dumas, spent the week­
end with the Skeeter M cAl- 
pincs.

And Feed

SECOND PLACE WINNER., .was the Earth Lions Club float with lovely Queen Peggy Upchurch 
dressed in a beautiful aqua formal dress with Misses Karen Barton and Kathy Clayton
with her on the float. Miss Upchurch represented the Earth Lions Club at the 
contest, held in Lubbock recently.

L i ons
r i ding 
Queen

Party Line...
Those enjoying home made 

icecream in the Darrell Saw­
yer Nome after the rodeo Sat­
urday night were Mr. and Mrs. 
Skipper Smith and Ronney of 
Littlefield; Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Smith and boys, Ncedmore;

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Smith, 
Liberal Kansas; Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Watts and Kim of Dim- 
initt and Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Sawyer and children. Earth.

Mr. and Mrs.M .G.W illiams, 
Archer C ity, spent  Sunday 
night with their daughter,Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Glasscock and 
Rocky.

Mrs. Kenneth Cowley went 
to Canyon last weekend and 
moved her daughter, Janice, 
home from WTSC for the rest 
of the summer. Janice attend­
ed WTSC for the first summer 
session.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Smith and 
boys, Ncedmore, Mr. and Mrs. 
Skipper Smith and Ronney of

Littlefield, Mr. and Mrs.How- 
ard Smith,Liberal.Kansas visi­
ted the Kenneth Sawyers Sat­
urday, and they all attended 
the rodeo Saturday with them. 
Ray and SkippcrSmith arc Mrs. 
Sawyer's brothers. H o w a r d  
is a cousin.

Vicki Weems. Clovis, New 
Mexico is spending the week 
with her grandmother, Mrs. 
Ada Rudd.

Mr. andMrs.Roy Neal visited 
the Leonard Stephens family 
in Lubbock. Sunday.__________

ANYONE FOR A DUNKING?,. Persons attending the first Rodeo performance Thursday night 
were privileged to throw the baseball, hit the clown in the mouth, and see some member of 
the Springlake Lions Club dunked ill the tank.

Texas, long known lor the 
production oF both feeder cat­
tle and feed grains, may soon 
begin combining the two into 
a new industry tor the state.

There are manv areas of the 
state that have tor some time 
produced a surplus of feed 
grain,says MP-626, "Demand 
For Feed Grain by Livestock in 
Texas." The new bulletin of 
theTcxas Agricultural Exper­
iment Station points out that 
tome of these areas are now 
becoming centers of feeding 
operations.

The publication is described 
as an analysis of production 
and consumption conditions 
existing in local areas and 
should serve as a basis for ev­
aluating feeding potentials in 
these areas. It explains,how­
ever, that a large amount of 
gram is not the only factor 
that determines if cattle feed­
ing will be profitable.

Evidence is disclosed ill the 
publication that grain is ship­
ped out of some areas during 
the harvest season and other 
feed grain shipped back m 
when Feed demands arise. The 
unnecessary t r anspo r t a t i on  
costs thus created add to the 
expenses o f the buyer and the 
seller of the feed, it says.

In addition to transportation 
cosu and feed quantities, 1 -
tors that affect pro f i t ab l e  
feeding o p e r a t i o n s  are the 
competitive location to meat 
processing plants and meat 
markets, and the managers' 
capabilities.

MP-626 analyzes the state 
feed grain situation by districts 
and Indicates that some dis­
tricts are deficit producers of 
grain while others produce a 
surplus. The study covered the 
years 1949,1954 and 1959.

Copies of the publication 
are available from the Agri­
cultural Information O f f F c e ,  
College Station, Texas

Eight Rural Accidents Reported 
For June In Lamb County
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HOW WOULD YOU LIKE TO RIDE THIS ONE” . . .This animal
is just one of the many ferocious bulla that cowboys, who 
entered in tfie bull riding event in the 19th annual Earth Rod * 
eo were riding at the three night performances. S t o c k  was
fnmished by Ratjen Stock Company of Happy.

"One Step A t A Time” 
Soil Supervisor’s Theme

"Soil Conservation is easy.if 
you do it with a plan--one 
step at a tim e." That's the 
theme of the L.'mb County Soil 
Conservation District Supervi­
sors, as they push for more 
District cooperators and more 
conservation measures on the 
land of the county.

Edward Mitchell, chairman 
of the board says,"It's easy to 
become a successful conserva­
tion farmer. You don't have to 
upset your future operation. 
Take it one step at a tune. A 
man learns to crawl before he 
learns to run. The same is true 
ofSoil and Water Conservation. 
We can reach our goal by tak­
ing just one step at a time if:

1. We know the best place to 
stan and what really pays off.

.. We adorx practices that 
really doing first and that w ill  
til right into a good conserva­
tion plant.

3. We don't fool ourselves 
into thiuking we are doing a 
complete job of conservatFoo 
after we've completed s few

] practices.
The SCO Board emphasises, 

states Mitchell, that every 
farmer and r a n c h e r  should 
have a Soil Conservation Plan. 
Local Soil Conservation Serv­
ice Technicians can provide 
planning and application assis­
tance insoil conserv atlon.This 
assistance is provided all co- 
operators of the SCD.

Party Una
Mrs. Carra Morgan returned 

home Monday afternoon from 
ten days stay in Lubbock with 
her mother, Mrs.Cora Hacker, 
and her son . Mr. and Mrs. Dean 
Morgan and children. Mrs .  
Morgan also had the pleasure 
of visiting with her sitter,Mrs. 
Juanita Mikita,Hayward,Cal­
ifornia, who was visiting Mrs.

[ Hacker, also.

Mrs. E.O. Lightloot Mean- 
fined to her home with an 

| infection.

VISIT THIS TO TA L ELECTRIC HOME
S U N D A Y

J U L Y

. . .f o r  the comfort of your fa m ily-yo u ’ll want a total electric home!

THIS B E A U T I F U L  E L E C T R I C  
K IT C H E N  IS E Q U I P P E D  W IT H  
B U I L T  IN

E L E C T R I C  R A N G E  
E L E C T R I C  C A N  O P E N E R  
E L E C T R I C  F O O D  C E N T E R  
D ISH W A S H E R  
D IS P O S A L

I N T E R C O M  W IT H  A M  A N D  F M  
R A D IO  T H R O U G H O U T  T H E  H O U S E

This room  is equipped with Light fo r  L iv ing . . . By this, w e  m ean,  
you can d ia l the light leve l d e s ire d  for a l l  o c c a s io n s .  , , .

ELEC TR IC  HEATING IS;
•  Safe

•  Comfortable
•  Dependable

•  Clean

•  Fast

The Jo y of Total Electric Living/

and costs less than you th in k ...

■

r i l l
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I nlimitni Fai'ililin For tun
Tourist information on Burnet, one of Central Texas’ 

finest vacation cities, lists many fine features.
Fact of the matter is, there are so many fine features 

in this wonderland of lakes and hills that it’s hard to 
relate all of them.

Perhaps Burnet’s best and most accurate claim is that 
it has “unlimited facilities for fun’’. To list a few 
features: Burnet is located among five lakes with a 
total of 76,000 surface acres of water; nearby Buchanan 
Dam is the largest multiple arch dam in the world; 
Inks State Park, located on the shores of Inks I.ake, 
covers 2,000 acres; nearby l.onghorn Caverns is the 
third largest in the world and is dramatically lighted 
throughout its two-mile expanse.

There are other recreational facilities such as parks 
and a golf course, but there also are historical sights to 
see. In addition to a fine museum, nearby Packsaddle 

, Mountain was the site of the last Indian battle in Texas.

Kil ('-arson'* Lust Fight
’’Kit” Carson, famous frontier fighter, had his last 

encounter with hostile Indians at the Battle of Adobe 
t Walls.
$ Site of this battle is marked just 30 miles northeast 
f o f  Stinnett, Texas, in the northern Panhandle area.

Under the protective cover of the adobe walls in Hutch- 
k inaon County, Colonel Christopher “Kit” Carson, com- 
|  manding a few companies oi 1' S. Troops, bra* oly 
V battled a band of Kiowa and Comanche Indians, killing 
w over 60 braves.

Though only a highway marker remains at the site, 
such battles and bravery have left a greater mark in 
the minds of all Americans.

Tex«ft llaa The Original
An American treasure is preserved by means of a 

| picture held in the Library of Congress.
1 You too can have such a picture. In fact you can take 
f it yourself, because Texas has the original subject. It is 

the San Ygnacio Ranch, on the Rio Grande between 
Laredo and Zapata. Texas.

This little river settlement was founded in 1790 and
the Spanish language is still the most prevalent 

i* On the ranch is a long series of buildings. All are one 
story structures but one It i* two stories tall with an 

•  overhanging balcony.
I  Ceiling beams in this stone building have the builder’s 
▼ name and the date of construction inscribed thereon.

You also will find nearby the old Fort San Ygna<
|that was built in 1835

OLDCU>KY I EADS THE PAHA DE.. .  Opening the 19th Annual Earth Rodeo Tliur*day afternoon at 
four o'clock, Hundred* were on hand to view the paiadc, .<» it marched down main itreet front 
the U  C Motel to Larth Cull Sutuxi. Stieeul float> were enured. *Uo tiding club*, bicycle 
(fata l, farm machinery auU liorxemcn nude up the parade.

Too Shifty To  Truat
Many a sailor ;*nd ship place their trust in a light-

^  ! LINES O f 1 WO WIKI l Of*MED entering the FFA Show Bam for th<. fret barb qu that bt gan at
b p.in. o.i the rodeo g'CHirufi. Delicious h.irbeque, bean«, pickle*, relishes and dr inks w e r e  
seoed to those attending the first rodeo performance.

Jacqueline and Becky Parlili 
daughters of the Earl Parish's, 
springlake, left Suuday after* 
noon for Canyon, where they

will attend BandCamp at WT 
for the next two weeka.

Mrs. W. H. Wagei. Mr. and 
Mrs. Clwood Jones, Taico, are

\ lilting this week with Mr. and 
Clarence Wages. Mis. Wagct 
IsCUrence's mother,and Mrs. 
jonea ii his sister.

house But when the Aransas Pass Lighthouse was built in Brown County near Brownwood, Icxas. 
in 1865, you can bet no one counted on the Paaa moving. I. *^nr* P01 a n’c'' 'ro" ’n suntan while you go

i However, shtfttng san-ls now have moved the Pass'1**1* ; " * '  fish,n*  ’ ^m im ing  at th,s nne ,ake ,n the
“  -  _____ nn rth w w t f  n « r t  n f  (  #»ntrnl lt>Ynsnorthwest part of Central Texas.

There's a wonderful 538-acre public park right on 
the lake too. It has cabins, picnic areas, a dining room, 
lunch counter, grocery store, dance terrace and loads 
of playground eouipment.

Don't miss it next time you're out that way. Or better 
K <-r i> ( Vt nil I I I ,  B r o w n *  M H i make your friends "blown" with envy by f i r i n g

They really do it ui» i.iown —  at Lake Brownwood — jy°ur next pleasure trip a Brownwood vacation._________

a mile south of the old lighthouse
Though this old beacon has been closed since 1952, 

others still are in use on our Texas Gulf Coast. Some of 
our Texas lighthouses have been designated as museums 
or parks and now an- used only by sightseers.

Mt. and Mr*. Robert O'Hair 
were in C.m.idI.’ ll Tuesday 
and attended (lie funeral of 
Mr*. Pjtitiice Holt. Mrs.Holt 
wai iik inotlier-ln-Uw of Mrs. 
O 'll ir's m a r ,  M r*.LM .H olt.

Thursday mglit guests ot Mt. 
aud Mrs. John La mg were Mr. 
and Mrs. L. \. Stephen* and 
Mrs.Kobcn Wade,Lin  Angeles 
California,

Our fifth president it famous for this 
Monroe Doctrine It protected new netiont from 

exploitation . . . insured established boundaries . . 
protected our national interest.

America’s rural electric systems with there w ere a similar type 
o f doctrine in the electric utility business. Owned by five million 
consumers, these rural electrics borrowed capital from the Rural 
Electrification Administration, built lines to rural people who had 
no electricity. Today they make important contributions to the 
economic and military strength o f the nation by providing first- 
class electric service in areas commercial utilities would not serve.

Now  their future is in jeopardy With the spread o f suburbs end 
smell industry to the open country, other power suppliers are try­
ing to take over the more choice rural electric areas. When they 
are successful, service to the more sparsely settled areas becomes 
economically difficult.

Commercial utilities are often successful in taking these territories 
because as legal monopolies they enjoy special powers and 
privileges.

This is why rural electric systems in many states seek fair play 
policies which will help maintain good electric service in all rural 
areas

BaiUy County Eloctric Cooperative Au 'n.
Sid tax-peytnf (arm orgmntaattoe'1

(  NMCt

Congratulations
TO

S E E  T H E  
B E A U T I F U L  

S U N K E N  
B A T H  T U B

Mr. 6 Mrs. Norman Subor

£ J

/

W E  A R E  P R O U D  O U R  F IR M  W A S  S E L E C T E D

Furnish and Install
TH E

TILE FLOORING -  CABINET TOPS
A N D

TILING IN THE BATHROOMS

O N  C O M P L E T I O N  O F  T H E IR  L O V E L Y  N E W  H O M E

A T T E N D  OPEN HOUSE SU N D AY

W E I N V I T E  YO U  TO  I N S P E C T  O U R  W O R K M A N S H IP .

McDaniels Furniture D Floor Covering, Inc.
C L O V IS ,  N E W  M E X IC O  P H O N E  7f>2 - 4481
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Lazbuddie News
by kin. C. A, WATION

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Fuller 
and children, Patsy, Albert, 
and Nancy moved to the sup­
erintendent's school residence 
last week. Fuller conies from 
Blanket,Texas,where he had 
been superintendent of schools 
there. Fuller holds aBS decree 
from Howard Payne College, 
and a masters from Southwest 
Texas State College.

Patsy is a Junior, Albert,Jr. 
is a freshman and Nancy is in 
the seventh grade. We wel­
come the Fullers to Lazbuddie.

A ll the teachers have been 
lured for the Lazbuddie school 
with the exception of th e  
music teacher.

Cynthia and Janie Harvey 
visited in the W.K.Harrison 
home, near Mulcshoe Sunday.

Mt. and Mrs. J.C. S t e v e n s  
and Brenda, from Anclcrou, 
visited last week with tne J.B. 
Jennings family.

Mr.and MrsJ.B.Wright spent 
the weekend in Lovington vis­
iting the Ray Lovejoys. Mrs. 
Lovejoys. Mrs. Lovejoy is their 
daughter.

Eight year old Rickie Hard- 
age, son of Mr. and Mrs, Wayne 
Hardagc, suffered bruises on 
his leg Sunday afternoon, be­
ing pinned between the bum­
per of his fathers car and the 
frame o f the boat, hooked to 
the car. Two Latin American 
men ran their car into the 
car, causing the accident, 
Hardagc had gone into the L. 
and H. store in Muleshoe to 
pick up picnic supplies after 
parking his car by the store. 
Rickie was taken to a hospital, 
in Muleshoe for treatment, 
and was released.

Miss Brends Mason, bride- 
elect of Gene Walker, was 
honored with a bridal shower 
Thursday afternoon July 11. at 
the Oklahoma Lane Commun­
ity Center.

Gues t s  w e r e  served pink 
punch from a beautifully dec­
orated table.The centerpiece 
was a white wedding bell, 
surrounded by pink roses. The 
chosen colors of pink and sil­
ver were carried out.

Those attending at the serv­
ing table were Dons Donaldson 
Pat Chitwood, Mery Faye Rig- 
ney and Linda Nelson. Mrs. 
Richard Hawkins registered 
the guest'.

The honoree, her mother and 
the prospective groom’s sister, 
Mrs. Bill Jennings, were pres­
ented lovely corsages of pink 
roses.

Approximately sixty five 
attended and many sent gi tu 
The hostess gift was an elect­
ee  mixer. Mrs. John Agee 
presented the program,& Mrs.

Wayne Peterson sai)g " I  Love 
You Truly" and '.'Those Wed­
ding Bells are Breaking Up 
That Old Gang of Mine, 

Hostesses were Mini. Raym­
ond Houston, Wayne Peterson, 
Jess Pendergrass, L.F. Brown. 
Claud Watkins, Walter Vetuer, 
Bernard Nelson, Dee Chitwood, 
Dec Brown, Sterling Donaldson, 
and J.nncs Robinson.

The Templet Family ’Reun­
ion was held at the Clovis 
Park Sunday. July 14th. Am ­
ong those attending from this 
area were Mr. and Mrs.Wayne 
Clark and ch I Id r en , Irma 
Templet and Jerry, the Walter 
Bakers and Anna Tempter. 
Approximately SO mended.

Congratulations to Mr.and 
Mrs. Albert Clark on the birth 
of a son, bom Saturday July 
13. The young man weighed 
8 pounds, and had not been 
named at this writing.

Visiting th e  Frank Hunts 
Sunday were thcil daughters, 
Mrs. Bill Hollar and children, 
Mrs.CharlesHipp and children, 
Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Littlefield and children,Hub.

Birthday greetings this week 
are extended to Gary Johnson, 
Murilan Fred, Mary Maxwell, 
Victor S c h u ma n n  , La Rita 
Wenner, Charlotte Seaton, 
L i nda  Hodges,  Linda Holt, 
Johnece Seaton, Lupe Flores, 
Suzanne Crooks, Benny Wats­
on, Billy Dean Eubanks, Lin­
da Gleason, Juan Garza, Ben­
ny Marrow and Doyle Crim, 

Visiting last week with Mr. 
and Mrs, Pete Jesco were her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Musil, Stamford and Leon  
Musil, Dallas,

Mr. and Mrs. T .L . Byrd ce le ­
brate their wedding anniver­
sary Thursday July 18.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Jones and 
Mr. and Mrs. Dub Harlin car­
ried Billie Jones from Mule­
shoe to catch a plane to C a '- 
lfornia, where Billie w ill be 
for a two weeks vacation.

Scotty Windham accompan­
ied by Ronald Ashford and 
Samnne Harlin were in Am ­
arillo from Tuesday through 
Thursday, attending an e lec ­
tric school. This schoolwjs 
sponsored by the Southwestern 
Public Service Company. The 
boys enjoyed the school and 
say it was very informative. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Dean,

in the Clyde Monk home.
Halfway, were guests Sunday

C l y ..............
Benny Watson was a Saturday

^JfarrisoO jM u^
night cut 
W tster Ra

Francis Implement Co. 
Your Ford Tractor Dealer 
Muleshoe. Texas 

Pd. Adv.

Camilla Wheatley and June 
Taylor enrolled at WTSC in 
Canyon Monday for the second 
summer session.

Mr.and Mrs.Ezra Whittington 
ofOlton visited Monday night 
with Mr.and Mrs.Skeeter Mc-
AI pine and girls.

Kathy Sue Wicks, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs, Bill Wicki, of 
Lubbock, Is visiting her grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Neal.

IT 'S DOWN AGAIN, WHO DONE IT ? ? .. Witnesses reported that some person hit this center light 
at the crossroads of Highway 70 and 385 Saturday morning and drove away without reporting it. 
This is just one of tlic many, many times tiie light has been knocked down.

f f  .  k J k :

r
MORTON’S SHERIFF’ S POSSE.. .  won first place honors over the other riding clubs in the parade 
Thursday, with ferry County, Brownfield, winning second and Portales receiv ing third p l Jce  
honors. Several riding clubs entered the parade from over the area.

Party Line
Mrs. Gene Browud visited 

Faye Adrian in the Littlefield 
Hospital Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. Kenneth Sawyer was in 
Canyon Friday, to move her 
daughter, Jean, home for the 
summer. Jean attended the

first summer session at WTSC. 
June Taylor a c c o m p a n i e d  
them home,

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Bills 
and girls. Denver C ity, were 
weekend v isitors in tne R. S. 
Cole home. Mr.Bills returned 
home Sunday, and Mrs. Bills 
and girls remained with her 
parents for several days visit.

Sunday dinner guests in the

R. S. Cole home were Mr. and 
Mrs.Claud Davis and Rodney, 
Lovington, N. M „ Mrs.Alice 
Martin and Mrs.Ethcl Lewallyu 
of Amarillo.

Sharon Jnd Debbie McAlpine 
went to Dumas Sunday with 
their grandparents, the C .O . 
McAlpines of Bandera, and 
spent the night with the E. E. 
McAlpines. They r e t u r n e d  
home Monday.

Announcing. . .
W A T C H  FOR T H E

OPENING DATE
O F  T H E

Wolverine 
Kning Room

In The Very Near Future
W E  P L A N  O N  H A V IN G  S O M E T H IN G

ENTIRELY NEW
FOR T H E  E A R T H  C O M M U N IT Y

W E W I L L  S T I L L  C O N T IN U E  TO S E R V E  YO U R  F A V O R I T E  
F O O D S  F R O M  THE W IN D O W  O N L Y ,  FOR A F €W W E E K S . .

Wolverine Drive In
E A R T H ,  T E X A S

S U N D A Y - 1 P.M.-5 P.M.

T H I S  L O V E L Y  
S U N K E N  L I V I N G  
R O O M  IS C O V E R E D  
W IT H  G O R G E O U S  
A V O C A D O  G R E E N
C A R  P E T ............
I T  B L E N D S  PER-  
F E C T L Y  W IT H  THE  
A N T I Q U E  P A N E L  
U N G ............

W E A R E  P R O U D  TO H A V E  B E E N  C H O S E N  B Y  M R . A N D  M R S . S U L S E R  
TO F U R N IS H  A N D  I N S T A L L  T H E  C A R P E T I N G  T H R O U G H O U T  THEIR  
N E W  H O M E . . .  W E  S T R IV E  A L W A Y S  TO  K E E P  A L A R G E  S E L E C T IO N  
O F  T H E  V E R Y  B E S T  C A R P E T  IN  S T O C K  TO  M E E T  T H E  N E E D S  O  F 
F IN E  W E S T  T E X A S  H O M E O W N E R S ..........

W H E N  YOU  T H IN K  O F  C A R P E T  
C A L L

The C A R PET WAGON
A N D  A R E P R E S E N T A T I V E  W I L L  
C A L L  O N  Y O U  W IT H O U T  O B L I  - 
G A T  IO N . . TO  SHOW Y O U  O U R  
C O M P L E T E  U N E  O F  C A R P E T . .  
IN YO U R  O W N  H O M E

MULESHOE- P i :oN F  A 430 i



Springlake News
ftr u r m  m a t l o c k

R.L. Byers. Jr.. K. B. Parish, 
and J.B. James went to Wich­
ita Palls recently on business.

Mr. and Mrs. Lowell Walden 
spent Saturday and Sunday in 
Ruidoso, N.M. with her brother 
and wife, Kev,and Mrs. Roland 
Swanner.

Rev, and Mrs. A.R, Stewart 
and family and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Baker attended the Ev­
angelistic Conference In Fort 
Woith recently.

Mr. and Mrs. Uonuie Clayton 
Susan and Keith have moved 
into their new brick home 
west of town.

Mrs. Dorothy M rlock and 
Jelf left Thursday morning 
from Amarillo via train for 
Ft. Wotth. They spent the 
night with a cousin, Mr.and 
Mrs. Les Green and Larry .  
Then. Friday morning, they 
left via train again tor Alba, 
tovisit her mother,Mrs.Thel­
ma McClanahati, and an unc­
le, Charles Dodson. They re­
turned Monday. Mrs. McClan- 
ahan had been in Alba for 
two months.

Mrs. Edna M c C l u r e  spent 
several days last week in the j 
home of net daughter, Mrs. 
Betty Cowell of Dinimitt.

Mr.and Mrs.How.ird McClure 
Mr. and Mrs. Duck Pack rd of 
Olton, and Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Joe Nunn left Wednesday uight 
for Bisbec, Arizona, after re­
ceiving word of the sudden 
death of the women’ s father. j 
Mr. Cooper. They returned 
home early Saturday morning 
with other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Byers, Jr. j  
returned home Sunday after an 
all expense paid vacation to 
Acapulco and Mexico City. J 
They a c c o m p a n i e d  other 
couples via plane, July 4th, 
from Amarillo.

Mrs. Marie Bibby and Mrs. 
ErenCaskey accompanied the 
9 and 10 year old GA's to the . 
Plains Baptist Assembly Camp 
near Floydada last Monday til i 
Wednesday. Those going were j 
Kathy Biboy.Jams Bridge,Na- ) 
dine Jarsh, Jenna and Jimma 
Banks, Kathy md Donna And­
erson, Susan Parish and Paula 
Nunn.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Parish and 
Susan took Jacqueline and Re­
becca to Canyon, where they 
will spend two weeks in band 
camp.

Ricky aud Danny Byers visit­
ed in Littlefield with their

J;randparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
eff Perkins and Mr. indMrs. 

R. L.Byers,Sr. while their pur- 
euts were oa vacation.

Mrs. Hugh Watson aud Mrs. 
Dorothy Washington accomp­
anied the 11 and 12 year olds 
GA's to Camp near Floydada,

Wednesday til Friday. Gals

^ were Cretia Washington 
ie Matlock, Jamie Wash­

ington, Ann Bearden, Deborah 
Stewart, A l ynn j ones  and 
Brenda Clayton.

Mrs. Bud Matlock. Mrs. Ern­
est Green, Mrs. Herbert Miller 
and Mrs. Lowell Walden went 
to the Plains Baptist Assembly 
camp nearFloydada last M oo 
day morning to finish cleaning 
the cabin befoie the GA girls 
arrived. They are iunch in 
Plainview on the way back.

Mrs.Kenncth Heard and boys 
of Littlefield visaed with her 
pareuts. Mi. and Mrs. Herbert 
Miller and boys Sunday.

George Choate was rushed to 
the Littlefield Hospital last 
week by Parsons' ambulance.

Hershcl Sanders was admit­
ted to the Littlefield Hospital 
Tuesday. He was p l a c e d  
in traction, due to a back in­
jury. He had been receiving 
treatment in Amarillo.

Jerry Don Sanders and his 
cousin of Olton escaped ser­
ious injury Thursday night, 
when a tire blew out on the 
Sanders car, causing it to ov­
erturn. They were taken to 
the Littlefield Hospital by 
their mothers, and remained 
over night. His cousin received 
a broken nose.

Mms. A.R. Stewart. Robert 
Huekabee, Robert Bridge.Clar­
ence Anderson, along with 
Becky and Jacqueline Parish, 
went co the camp near Floy­
dada Tuesday, to help serve 
the noon meal tor the GA girls.

Sherry McDaniel accompan­
ied her aunt and uncle, and a 
cousin from Littlefield on a 
vacation in New Mexico last 
week.

Mr.and Mrsjimmy Ray Banks, 
Jcuiia, Jimma, Dapha and Ray 
Van spent last weekend in 
Lawton, Oklahoma with friends.

Mr.and Mrs. Jimmy Coleman 
and boys visited Sunday witn 
her mother, Mrs. Do Sanders.

Mrs. Dorothy Matlock and 
Hofcy and Debbie Ma t l o c k  
shopped in Plainview, Tuesday.

Mrs. Eddie Crocker has been 
a patient in the Littlefield 
Hospital.

Mr.andMrs.David Hocks and 
children of Lubbock spent Sat­
urday night and Sunday with 
his brother and fam ily, Mr. and 
Mrs.W.B. Mucks.

Miss Mary Ann McAnally of 
Hobbs. N. M. and Miss Muriel 
Johnson of Amarillo spent last 
weekend with Mr. andMrs. Er-

F1RST RODEO EVER TO ATTEND..was enjoyed by Rick Roberson, on the left, from San Fran­
cisco. California. Rick is the nephew of Morrell Green, backfield coach at Texas Tech. Edd 
Haley is shown with Roberson and Green. Green had always heard about Earth's Rodeo be i ng  
the best in the area, and had Rick flown into Lubbock especially for the lodeo, since the lad 
had uevet had the opportunity to see otic.

THIRD PLACE WINNER . . .was the Earth Rainbow Girls float, depicting the colon of the 
bow. Girls riding on thl float were dressed in white and included Carolyn Kelley, Worthy 
visor. standing in the center; other officers seated on the float ate Kathie Browud.
Prather, Ollte Pearl Waide, Shirley Walker, A licia Galloway, Kathy Richardson,
Brock, Brenda O'Hair and Sharon McAlpine.

Summer Time 
To Tackle 
Reeding Habits
Summer is a good time to 

deal with the problem of stu­
dents who duck books so suc­
cessfully that by the time they 
reach high school they are 
completely out o f  reading 
practice, and have difficulty 
doing regular school work,  
according to Changing Times, 
the Kipltnger Magazine,

An article in the current issue 
of the magazine advises the 
following prtcedure for parents 

"Take tile child to the public 
library regularly; drop into the 
bookstore with film for the fun
of browsing; and introduce 
him to the hundreds of good 
exciting paperbacks sold in 
drugstores and supermarkets. 
The reason many students don’ t 
read is simply tnat they rarely 
come in touen with interesting 
hooks."

The best way to help young­
sters make a choice is to guidc 
them towards books that coin­
cide with their main interests. 
The biography of a baseball 
hero, the story of a horse, a 
guide to coin collecting, and 
so on, the article continues.

But most important, accord­
ing to Changing Times, is to 
boost the prestige of books 
within the family. "Neatly 
half the houses in the country 
don’ t have any bookshelves at 
all. Many parents pressure 
then children to read, but 
never open a book themselves,"

Francis Implement Co. 
Your Ford Tractor Dealer 
Muleahoc, Texas 

Pd. Adv.

nest Baker.
Mrs.Paultne Hucks took Ron­

nie to Lubbock, Friday for a 
medical check-up.

Dinner guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
W.B.Hucks and family Sunday 
were Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Bol- 
inger and family of Hereford; 
Mr. and Mrs. David Hucks and 
family of Lubbock and Mr.and 
Mrs. Hardin Gum of Edinburg.

Mrs. J. B. James, Linda and 
Renay and Mrs. G.C.Bearden, 
Sr. returned home last week, 
alter several days visit in 
Clarksville with Mrs, Bearden's 
sister, who is seriously ill.

Kent Hinson spent several 
days m Dallas recently with 
his grandparents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Jess Watson.

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Davis

and Rodney of Lovington.N. M. 
visited Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Max Goforth and chi ldren. 
They also visited in the home 
of Mr.and Mrs. Wayne Davis.

MrsAlpha Dee Whitfotd went 
to Amherst Wednesday, and 
brought Mrs. Lula Brock out to 
the community to visit for a 
while.

Mrs. Bruce Whitfotd and Mrs.

Pearl Nelson of California is 
visiting relatives in the com ­
munity.

Mr.and Mrs.Harold Fox and 
children of San Juan. N .M . 
spent the weekend with her 
sister and family Mr.and Mrs. 
Buddy Hedges,

Mrs.EdnaCook was admitted 
to a hospital Sunday night,

Mancll Choate,of Callfom- 
is was called to the bedside 
of his father, George Choate, 
who suffered a heart attack.

Pat Goforth attended funeral 
services for her uncle, Bill 
Stubblefield of Amherst. Sat­
urday morning.

Mr. ind Mrs. Spike Dent of 
Austin visited friends and rel­
atives in the community last 
Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs.Johnny Stockcly 
of Lubbock visited Sunday witn 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Goforth. 
Connie and T o n i  returned 
home with them.after spend­
ing the week here. Mr.and 
Mrs. MaxGoforth and children 
ate dinner with them, also.
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Pointers For 
Lond-Shoppers

There is just one way to get 
exactly the right house m ex­
actly the tight location; buy 
some land and build. This ad­
vice in the current issue of 
Changing Times, the Kipllugcr 
Magazine,includes the fo llow  
ing twelve critical points which 
should be checked befoie a 
land purchase is made.

--The environment. The big 
point to remember is that the 
surroundings will not remain 
forever as they are when the 
lot first is viewed. Today’ s se­
rene, pastoral setting can be­
come t omor r ow ' s  cloverleaf 
intersection, oil tank farm ot 
a part mem development. Check 
the county planning office to 
find out what uses are proposed 
for all the land surrounding the 
property.

--Size and shape. Usually a 
plot looks larger in its natural 
state than it does after it D 
built on. In rectangular lots, 
66 feet across the front and 100 
feet in depth is minimal. An 
irregular shape is not necessar­
ily a problem, but is should be 
studied carefully to make cer­
tain it is not.

--Topography. Is the lay of 
the land suitable for the type 
structure to be built upon u? 
If extensive changes in grade 
levels wil l  be necessary it may 
be wise to search further. Good 
drainage is essential--the land 
should he s o m e w h a t  higher 
than streets ot roads that give 
access to it.

-•Boil and subsoil. Ideally, 
the soil should be stable and 
free of large rocks. If it wi l l  
be necessary to install a septic 
system.have a percolation test 
made to determine whether 
the soil is suitable. Any doubts 
about subsoil conditions should 
be resolved by a c iv il engineer.

--Boundaries. Have a survey 
made and get permanent mar­
kers placed on the corners of 
d l l  property. Surveying the 
typical lot only costs $50 or so 
and will  reveal any cnroach- 
ments on the property.

--Deed restrictions. The use 
that can be made of the land 
may be limited by restrictions 
that run with the deed. Have 
a lawyer check fot booby traps.

--Zoning. Look into the zon­
ing, fot it governs what you 
may do and what future neigh­
bors may do.

--Taxes due. Any unpaid 
taxes from the past must be 
paid up to make a clear trans­
fer of title. In addition,there 
w ill be taxes due for the cur­
rent tax year. These should be 
pro-rated between the buyer

and the seller.
• •Special assessments. Find 

out whether any special assess­
ments (for a drainage district, 
toads or tome other improve­
ment) are payable and arrange 
for their settlement before ac­
cepting title.

-•Easements, Have a lawyer 
check for the existence of any 
easements on the property and 
explain their significance to 
you.

--Utilities. Detetmine whe­
ther gas, electricity, water, 
sewerage services are available 
and how much it will cost to 
take advantage of them.

• •Solar orientation. A lot 
that runs notth and south pro­
vides more opportunity for sit­
ing a house to take advantage 
of the sun's warmth in the 
winter, and to avoid its fiercest

?,lare in the summer. On a 
arge lot,of course, the house 

may be turned to ptesent its 
best face to the tun regardless 
of the lot's orientation.

Party Lina
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 

and Mrs. David Johnson and 
Don were Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Jones, Frederick.Okla., Mr.and 
Mrs.W. D.Black Md children, 
Littlefield, Mr. and Mrs. J.E. 
Montgomery, Leanna and Leo. 
Levelland; Mr. and Mrs. Dale 
Montgomery and Sherry .Mule- 
shoe; Mrs. Ida Hall and Mrs. 
Edna Peel, Amherst; Mr.and 
Mrs. Pat Mont  g o m e  r y and 
Dwayne, and Mrs .  J e w e l l  
Montgomery.

Dale Dent and Boyd Clayton 
left Monday morning for Abi­
lene where they will enroll at 
ACC fot the second summer 
term.

Ronnie Dent of Lubbock spent 
the past week with the Tuffy 
Dents and worked for his father. 
Chubby Dent, at Dent Farm 
Supply, while the Dents are 
on vacation.

Mr. and Mrs. David Johnson 
and Don left Tuesday fot Abi­
lene, to visit their son, Mr. 
and Mrs.Ronnie Johnson, and 
Melanie.

Mr.and Mrs.Wendell Clayton 
and girls spent four days last 
weekin Dallas,visiting friends 
and touring Six Flags Over 
Texas. They returned home 
Saturday.

Carla Glasscock, daughter of 
theBazel Glasscock's is spend­
ing this week vtth friends in 
Happy.the J. W, Byrdfarms,

Mrs, Leonard Lane was a 
Sunday afternoon caller in the 
home of Mrs. R. S.Cole.

*  T U R N K E Y  JOB
* G U A R A N T E E D  W O R K M A N S H IP
*  G U A R A N T E E  O F  O P E R A T I N G  C O S T

*  G U A R A N T E E D  E Q U I P M E N T

POM TEAR ROUND COMPORT, NOTHING EXCELS WEST1NGHOUSE HEATING AND REF- 
RIDEJUTir AIR. . i r r  US HELP YOU WITH YOUR HEATING AND COOLING ...

KELLEY
REFRIGERATION

AMO

ELECTRICAL SERVICE
302 Broadway - Plainview - CA 4-7548

v  i -  • * » w * K i 4 *  • i f  * • * . » »  > 4



The Earth Newt-bun, Thursday, July 18,1063*Pg.H

SELL A N D  P R O F I T . . .  B U Y  A N D  SAVE . . .  G E T  A BET T ER J OB . . .  HIRE G O O D  H E L P

MONUMENTS 
Wlnaiboro Blue Oranite 

White Oeor*la Marble
and Other*

Including Bronte for 
Memorial Park Specifications 
Bee Percy or Connor Paraona 

or Cell Collect 
Olton, Texas

Pbone 286 2621 or 285-2767

Lamb County P C G  
Meet in Littlefield

Over 200 Lamb County far­
mers and business men atten-

Relax
While

Viewing
T V

of ENGLANDERS 
TENSION EASE

SLEEP SET
• See it on tho JACK 

PAAR SH O W  on 
NBC-TV

• Tost it in YOUR O W N
HOME! ,

Tension Easi Airlon provides the 
kind ol difference that really 
counts Gives you fresher, cleaner 
sleep— because it's odorless, non- 
allergenic. Millions of air cells 
live you resiliency plus support 
never before known1 So lightweight 
that a child can carry it! Yet won 
derfully strong to give years of 
service Tension-Ease foundation 
is the perfect compimon lor your 
Airlon mattress to give you relai 
Ing support.

*5 9 75
Ttwm Si/*

• *c h  p itc *

F U LL  S IZ E  $64.75 *a c h  p s c #
M atch ing  T«nnon  E a t *
Foundation at t a m *  prices

King Furniture 

and Appliance
315 N. Broadway 

Phone 647-3331 

DIMMITT

0. D/g
Pump and Machine
Located on Brownd - White
Equipment Co. Lot Two 
Hlni’ks West Of Caution

ki«ht.

I ET I  S REPAIR 

YOUR PUMP 

AND GEAR HEAD 

BEFORE I HE IRRIGATION 

SE A SON ST ARTS 

ACETYLENE AND 

ELECTRIC WELDING 

GENER A1 SHOP WORK 

NEW PUMP SALES

0. D.'s
Pump and Machine

Phone 257 2951 — Earth

OUICKSALL PRYOR CO, INC) 
Automobile Parte 

fVippllee 4  
Equipment 

P O lloi 587 
Pho. 257 2851 
Earth. Text*

ded a meeting In Littlefield 
July 11 and reelected John D. 
Smith,farmer,and Jack Wick­
er, President of the Security 
State Bank of Littlefield, as 
directors of Plains Cotton 
Growers, Inc. for another year. 
Principal speaker at the meet­
ing was PCG Executive Vice 
President Gerogc W. Pfeiffen- 
berger.

The large turnout for the 
meeting was indicative of the 
intense interest that is devel­
oping over the High Plains in 
the cotton industry. L itile-

ot Plyv
Boar, 25 HOflcpower Johnson 
M ew--Factory bmii trailer. 
V .L . Smith. Jr.

7/19/2tp

FOR RENT - - 26 foot lot avail­
able for trailer house space. 
Contact rYrl Jordan.

7 IB/-ftp

TOR SALE.. V 8 CMC engine 
complete TIC cubic inch. Ex­
tra good condition. Contact 
Wi l l  It G i d con  , Springlake 
School Bus Barn.

7/4/tfc

A URGE CROWD ATTENDED THE FREE BARBEQUE.. .  prepared by members of the Larth C of 
C , which began t 6 p. m. t the PFA Show Bam, on the Rodeo grounds... l h> t. ■  wa* few 
witii a paid admission ticket to the first rodeo performance.

T  e  X  A

The H U H  NEWS-SIIN
A S S O C I A T I O N

1963
Published Each Thuraday at Earth, Taxaa

Entered as Second Class Matter at the E*oetofflca at Earth, 
Texaa. October 1, 1854 — Under Act of Cungrees March 2, 1678

SUBSCRIPTION KATE 
Earth and Trade Territory, per year 1800 

11 75

CLASSIFIED KATES 
4c per word, first insertion, Sc per word 
Minimum.

thereafter — 40c

ADVERTISING EtATES GIVEN ON REQUEST

ROSS and POLLY M lUUUaON lubltsbars

f ic ld V B a ll of Fife” Chamber 
of Commerce sponsored the 
meeting,and chamber mem­
bers travelled all over the 
county d i s cuss i ng  cotton's 
problems with farmers, gniners

We Do

Ele ctrical
Contracting
Harvey Bass 

Appliance
Muleshoe, Texas

I

NO BETTER 

G I F T  

T H A N  a

NECCHI
Sewing Machine

S - e  T h e m  At

Necchl-Elna 
Sewing And 

Appliance Center

H A R V EY  B ASS 
A PPLIANC E

MUL E S HOE ,  T E X A S

BARRETT 'S  
CLEANERS

Approved Sanitonc Service 
Laundry Service

Pick-Up and Delivery On 
1 UesJays and Fridays

IQ'J E. 10th Littlefield,Texa»

LEGAL NOTICES

ORDINANCE NO .54

FOR SALE--3" Peerless Pump. 
S horsepower motor. Phone 
257-4321. Springlake Schools. 

6/13/tfc

FORSAI.E-3 Bedroom House 
3 1/4 miles west, I north.See 
Norman Sulser. or cal l  Ihm- 
mitt M 7-3649.

5/9/tfc

WANTf  D--Baby sitting in my 
home. Phone Sandy Randolph. 
257-4882.

6/27/4tc

WANTED---Someone to do 
general house work one or two 
days a week. Phone 257-4371.

See U» For All Your

E
48

VETERINARY
SUPPLIES

Earth Elevator

rXJLDEBS GRAIN. WO
DAILY BUYERS F O R  C A T T U  

F E E D E R S
Federal Storage License

\V« Can Use Your Grain

Have Seml-Llft l.o«.4iion

8udgn Livestock and 
Feeding Oo.

R H e n s  2X7 6821 —  S u d in  T n a i

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORI- 
LNG THE ARREST WITHOUT 
W A R R A N T  OF PERSONS 
FOUND IN SUSPICIOUS PLA- 
CI->, AND UNDER CIWJUM- 
STANCES WHICH REASON­
ABLY SHOW THAT SUCH 
PERSONS HAVE BEEN GUILTY 
OF SOME FELONY OR BREACH 
i i  i 111 PI A C I , OR 7 HREAT- 
ENLD, OR ARE ABOUT TO 
COMMIT SOME OFFENSE A- 
(  D4S1 1 HE LAW OF THIS 
STATE OROFTHE ORDINAN­
CES OF THE C ITY  OF EARTH 
AND DECLARING AN EMER­
GENCY.

WHEREAS, the City of Earth 
is without an Ordinance gov­
erning the arrest without war­
rant of persons found in suspi- 
c i o u s  p l a c e s ,  and under 
circumstances winch reason­
ably show that such persons 
have been guilty of some fel- 
only or breach of the peace or 
threatened or are about to 
commit some offense against 
the laws of this State or ord­
inances of the City of Earth, I 
and,

WHEREAS, complaints have 
been received by the Police 
Department of the City of 
Earth from citizens within the 
City concerning persons being

FOR SALE!
Used

SEWING
MACHINES

•9« u p
H A R V E Y  BASS 

A P P LIA N C E
Muleshoe, Texas

M V N E  FU N ERAL HOME
AMHERST.TEXAS —PHONE 246 3351

HAMMOm

rUHEJLAL HOMS

Ambulance Sendee

Pbone M5 5121 

LITTLEFIELD. TEXAS

£

CITIZENS STATE BANK
ftipjtti Surplus ud Profile, Over 5225. 000-00 

Member P O L O

For All Your
•  MUFFLER - TAIL 

PIPES
•  DUAL MUFFLER 

SETS . .
•  FENDER SKIRTS
•  LOWERING BLOCKS
•  CUSTOM MAD* 

SKAT COVERS . . .
Oo To

*McCormick Bros. 
Auto Parts
Main Street

Littlefield, Trial

seen in suspicious places, ant 
WHEREAS.tin Police Depart­

ment of the City of Earth is in 
need of such Ordinance to 
protect them In the discharge 
of their duties,

NOW, THEREFORE, Bh IT 
O R D A I N E D  BY THE C ITY 
COUNC IL OF THE C ITY OF 
EARTH, TEXAS;

I.
The City Council of Earth, 

Texas, hereby authorizes the 
law enfotcement officers of 
the City of Earth, Texas to 
arrest. without warrant, per­
sons found in suspicious places, 
and under c i rc u mst ance  s 
which reasonably siiow that 
such persons have been guilty 
of some felony, or breach of 
peace, or threatened, or are 
about tocommit some offense 
against the laws of this State 
or ordinances of this City.

U.
-A 11 ordinances or parts of 

■ordinances in conflict here­
with are hereby repealed in­
sofar as the same are in con­
flict with the provisions hereof.

It is hereby made the duty 
of such officer to take such 
person into custody, or if 
necessary for their safe keep­
ing, to put them in the City 
Jail, and at the earliest time 
practicable, bring them with 
all the evidence and proof 
applicable to their case, be­
fore the Corporation Court for 
investigation and a hearing.

IV.
The fact that an emergency 

exists and the Mayor has so 
declared in writing, this Ord­
inance shall become effective 
immediately upon its first 
reading.

PASSED this 6th day of May, 
A. D. 1963, by the following 
vote. 5 voting 'for". 0 voting 
'against .

APPROVED this 6th day of 
May. A, D. 1963.

M. W. Messet
Mayor of the City of Earth
Texas.

ATTEST:
Ruby* Anderson
City Secretary, City of Earth, 

Texas.

and businessmen, and drum­
ming up interest in the meet­
ing. Troy Amies, Chamber 
President, commented: "W e 
realize the importance of the 
industry to both farmers and 
businessmen in this county 
and we want to do everything 
possible to find solutions to 
the industry's problems."

Pfeiffenberger.who recently 
leturned from a "round the 
world" trip during which he 
visited textile people in most 
o f tin world's major cotton 
markets, told the group that 
there was a great potential 
market for the Kind of cotton 
grown in this area, especially 
in the far cast. He added that 
wlut is needed is more prom­
otion and advertising of our 
cotton to capitalize on these 
markets and others that are 
developing as a result of the 
world's population explosion.

According to Gene Garrison, 
Executive Vice President of 
the Lamb County Chamber of 
Commerce, the Chamber had 
three top priority agricultural 
items for work during the 1963 
year: (1) Attracting Industry 
r e l a t e d  t o  a g r i c u l t u r e .

(2 ) Stimulating the use of ag­
ricultural products, and (3) 
Increasing net farm income. 
"In talking with people in 
various parts of the county." 
he said, "we are told that we 
can best accomplish the third 
of these itmcs through support 
of Plain* Cotton Growers and 
its programs."

Plains Cotton Growers o ffic ­
ials expressed their apprecia­
tion for the work done by the 
Littlefield group in making 
the Lamb County meeting an 
unqualified success.

Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leon Foster, Cheryl 
aud David were Mrs. M. B. 
Baldwin, Ka r en  G r e e n  of 
Plamview, and Duane Harris.

Mr. and Mrs. B.C. Vinson 
Gardena. California, visited 
last week with Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Huff and Donald and 
Mrs. Leta Kelley,Beverly and 
Billie. Mrs. Vinson is Mrs. 
Huffs and Mrs. Kelley's sister.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Heston and 
Sharon, Grandview, Mo. vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs.Marvin Huff 
and Donald last week. Mr. 
Heston it Mrs. Huff's cousin.

Party Um...
Mrs. John Alexander and sis- 

ter-irwlaw, Mrs. Lena Hawk of 
Dallas, returned home Thurs­
day, after visiting in the Dan 
Hulcy home. Mri.Alexander 
was here to be with her son, 
James, who had Ins tonsils re­
moved at the Littlefield Hos­
pital last Monday. The A lex- 
andet children ate sending 
the summer with their grand­
parents, the Dan Hulcy’ s.

Mr. and Mrs. John Foley and 
Lonnie,Greenville, Mrs. Ethel 
Bloodworth, Mr. and Mis. Em­
mett Harper, Olton. visited 
Sunday a f i e  m o o n  with the 
Leon Fosters. Mrs. Foley and 
Mrs. Bloodworth are Mrs. Fost­

er's aunts. Mrs. Harper is her
cousin.

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Hulcy and
their grandchildren, Teresa, 
Darryl and James Alexander
visited Mrs. Hulcy'i uncle,the 
Roy Gary family in Post,Sun­
day.

Mrs. Nina Adrian returned 
home Saturday after spending 
the past two weeks at the bed 
side of her father, L.E.Clark, 
who is seriously ill in a Qua - 
nah hospital.

Mt. and Mrs. Charlie Jones 
and Rory, Olton, attended the 
Earth Rodeo Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. V .T .  Gooch and 
grandson, Gary Kelley visited 
in Lubbock Sunday with their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Jack
Seay.

TO P A R T Y  WITH GOOD CREDIT

REPOSSESSED SINGER CONSOLE 
SLANT NEEDLE MODEL. CAN Z IG ­

ZAG, MAKE BUTTONHOLES, SEW ON 
BUTTONS, DO FANCY STITCHING, ETC 
9 PAYM ENTS  OF $5.92 or $47.50 CASH.

W R I T E :  C R E D IT  M A N A G E R ,  1114 19th ST .
LUBBOCK, TEXAS

9M M Y I-S

m W

W E  A R E  I N D E E D  P R  

S E L E C T E D  B Y  M R .

S E E  THIS B E A U T I F U L  S U N K E N  

B A T H  T U B ,  T H E  F IR S T  O F  THIS  

K IN D  IN T H E  A R E A .

O U D  T O  H A V E  B E E N  

A N D  M R S .  N O R M A N

S U L S E R  T O  D O  A L L  T H E  P L U M B I N G  

F O R  T H E I R  N E W  H O M E .  F O R  R E A L  P E R ­

S O N A L I T Y  I N  A  H O M E ,  D O N ' T  M I S S  THIS

O P E N  H O U S E  S H O W I N G

U U M f U M K C O .
E A R T H ,  T E X A S



Specials for July \
19-20-22-23 24 

D O U B L E  G U N N  B R O S . S T A M P S  
O N  T U E S . &  W E D .

W IT H  P U R C H A S E  |

\  O R  M O R E  I C W cB c tI
3 » > T '
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Sunnyside News...
By Teeny Bowden

Mr. and Mrt. Tom Metier. 
Bart and Shelly Dawn of Lub­
bock visited Ust Saturday with 
Mr, and Mrs, Alton Loudder 
and with Mrs. James Powell 
and children and Mrs. Ezell 
Sadler,

J,E. Shirey received a call 
from till sitter, Mrs.Dave White 
ofSallnu*. California, on his 
birthday, last Sunday to wish 
him a nappy birthday.

Mn.Kubcrt Paschal and Mar- 
vulynne Durham took the Jun­
ior <3A'» to Camp at Plains 
BaptistAisembly near Floyda- 
da, Monday through Wedhesd- 
ay. Tho girls gong were Bob­
by Jan Blackburn. Janet Elliott, 
Norma Munoz. Janie Paschal, 
Sandy Loudder, Terry Crisp 
and Ann Spencer.

Mr. and M s. Rex Jenkins re­
turned home Monday from a 
week’ s vacattonat theircabin 
at Lake Thomas near Snyder.

Mrs.Ezell Sadler, Mrs. James 
Powell nd children, and Mrs. 
L. B. Bowden visited Monday 
afternoon w i t h  Mrs .  Lowell 
Westmoreland and children.

Ruth Ann.Harry Jr. and Mary 
Lynn Harris of Palmyria, Mis­
souri arrived Tuesday to visit 
a week or so with Mr. and Mrs. 
Weldon Bradley and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Dixon of 
Dimmitt. Their parents. Rev. 
and Mrs. Harry Harris joined 
them Saturday and spent Sat­
urday night with the Bradleys.

Mr.and Mrs.Vernon Scott and 
boys of Fnoua arrived Wed­
nesday and stayed until Sunday 
with Mr. anc Mrs. W e l d o n  
Bradley and guests. Mr. Scott 
was in an auto accident near 
Dimmitt Wednesday, but es­
caped injury.

Mrs.M. D. Durham. Mrs. Troy 
Blackburn, Mrs. Alford Crisp, 
and Mrs. Earl Phelan went to 
Plains Baptist Assembly Wed­
nesday to help serve the noon 
meal.

W. E. Loudder returned home 
from Breckenndge Wednesday.: 
He came home with his brother, 
Ben Loudder and a nephew, : 
Hershel Thomlinsoo ofCanyon 
and Mr. Thomlmsor ’ • father- 
in-law.

The WMS Night Circle met 
for the G e n e r al Missionary i

L.B. Bowden was in charge of

An Altar Prayer Meeting was I 
conducted in tne Prayer Serv- | 
ice. Wednesday night.

Mrs. Bill Ott of Hereford vis­
ited Thursday with Mis. Milton 
Ott and Mrs. Alton Loudder.

Bill Ernest Wheat of Spring- ■ 
lake visaed Wednesday through 
Friday with !us grandparents, I 
Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Shirey. Jim. i 

Mrs. Joe Edd Carson .Danny ; 
and Shar ia o f Hart visaed 
Thursday afternoon with Mrs, 
Houston Carson and children.

I V  WMS Day Circle met 
Thursday a f te  m o o n  for the : 
General Missionary Program. 
Mrs.L. B. Bowden had charge of 
the program. The Beginner 
Sunbeams also met wun Mrs. 
Raymond U lley.

Paula Jean Loudder returned 
from Ruidoto. N. M. Thursday 1 
night, by bus.

Ben Ray Holcomb. Jr.spent 
Thursday and Friday with his 
grandparents. Mr. and Mrs. J. 
T . Hoicomb.Carolyn, Johnnie 
and Butch.
Mrs. Alton Loudder and M n j 

Douglass Loudder visited with 
Mrs. Irvm Ott and boys of Big 
Square Friday.

W anda Jenkins was home from I 
Odessa for the weekend.

Keith Johnson and Linda Oden 
of Earth were united in mar­
riage in the Sunnyside Baptist 
Church Friday evening. Rev. M. 
D. Durham performed the dou­
ble ring ceremony. Music sel­
ections were given by k in ,C e­
cil Slover, accompanied by 
Janice Cowley at the piano.

Wanda Jenkins was the brides 
maid,and Jo Ann Bulls was the 
matron of honor.Mickey Wag­
goner was best man, and Cla- 
Durn Stewart w is groomsman, 
Lee Oden and Don Layman were 
ushers.

A shower was held m connec­
tion with the reception m the! 
Fellowship Hall following the 
ceremony. Gifts were displayed 
In a room off the LUU. Hostes­
ses for the shower were Mrs. J. j  
Paul Waggoner. Mrs. Tex Con- 
ard. Mrs.Rex Jenkins, Mrs. E.R4 

r». Troy 
ird Bndg 

Weldon Bradley. Rehearsal (or 
the wedding was held Thursday 
night.

Mrs. Dclmer McMillen and 
Gary of De n ve r . Colorado 
Spent Thursday night with her 
Sister. Mr. and Mrs. J. Paul  
Waggoner,Mickey and Jimmy.

Mrt. Euless Waggoner's motfe! 
•r. Mrs. Francis will Hams of 
Mulethoe, underwent major 
surgery in Lubbock Friday. 
Mrs. Waggoner has been with 
her moet of the time. Her 
car was stolen Saturday night 
while she was there.

Several from the community 
attended the funeral services 
for Bobby Sloan in Earth last 
Monday.

Mrt. J, E. Shirey and Jimmy 
and Mrs, Joe Edd Wheat and 
Bill Ernest of Springlike visit- 
-d with Mrs. W. E. Herrin in

Ftancis Implement Co. 
Your Ford Tractor Dealer 
Mulethoe, Texas 

Pd. Adv.

Sadler, Mrs. Troy Blackburn, 
Mrs. Howard Bridges and Mrs.

the Knight Nursing Home in 
Littlefield Tuesday.

Mts.Glenn Reid and Mrs. Bob 
Walke and girls from Level- 
land visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
J. E. Shirey and Jimmy Wed­
nesday. Tney and Mrs. Shirey 
visited with Mrs.Joe Edd Wheat 
and baby at Sprntglake in the 
afternoon.

Mrs. Leslie Loudder was ad­
mitted to the Castro County- 
Hospital 111 Dimmitt Saturday.

Mike Me Mi 1 leu of Denver, 
Colorado spent Saturday niglu 
with Mr. and Mrt. J. Paul W g-

Mtckey and Jiinm
Rita Holcomb was

goner
home from

Lubbock Saturday night and 
Sunday. She visited 111 the 
Sunday morning worship s e r v ­
ices.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Durham 
and children of Irving, neat 
Dallas, vtilled Saturday aiul

spent Saturday night with Rev. 
and Mrs. M .D. Durham and 
Marvalynne. Mr. Durham is 
Rev. Durham's nephew.

Wmst011 Waggoner returned 
home from National Guard 
duty Sunday. Mrs. Waggoner 
returned from Colorado, the 
early part of the week.

Mx. and Mrs. J, Paul Waggon­
er and boys and Mr. and Mrs, 
Troy Blackburn and girls at­
tended the Ball reunion InOI- 
ton, Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. James Powell 
and children visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. Woodrow Powell and 
children of Earth. Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Bradley
ud family, Mr.and Mrs.Carl 

Bradley, Mr. and Mrs.Vernon 
Scott and children. Rev. and 
Mrs. llarry Harris and family 
of Palmyria, Missouri were 
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Dixon of Dim- 
mitt.

Larty Don Bills was honored 
with a picnic and outing at 
Bulfalo Lake last Sunday, on 
his birthday. Those going were 
Mr. and .Sirs. R.V. Bills and

Larry Don, Mr.and Mrs.Richard 
Bills, Randy and Elaine and 
Lee Bradley.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Baker and 
W 111 la  m Harold of Slaton, 
spent the weekend with her 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Cecil 
Curtis,Don and Deb'ne.

Mr. and Mrs. Percy Hart of 
Hart visited Sunday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
Bridges. Mr. and Mrs. Houston 
Carton and children alto visit­
ed for a while and had ice 
cream with thern.Mr.and Mrs. 
John Bridges and boys of Earth 
stopped in for a few minutes 
visit.

Mr.and Mrs. Clarence Bagg­
ett of Herelord visited Sunday  
afternoon with Leslie Loudder 
and children. The girls went 
home with them for the night.

Mt. and Mrs. R ymond Lewis 
and children of Olton visited 
Sunday afternoon with Mr.and 
Mrs. Raymond Lilley. Mr.and 
Mrs. Floyd Ivey also enjoyed 
tee cream with them.

Eighty-seven attended Sun­
day School with 44 in Training 
Union Sunday.

Sorghum Midge Menace 
To Area Crain Growers
The adult midge Is a small, 

fragile, orange colored, gnat 
like insect about 1/13 men in 
length.The majority of midge 
complete their life cycle in 
14 lu 16 days. The lust genct- 

tn age
develops In seed heads of

rHe1
Johusong r  >ss and/or other 
grasses. The newly-emerged
adults may fly several miles 
to fields of gram sorghum at 
the lime seed-heads begin to 
emerge from the boot. The 
female midge lives for only 
one totwodays,and the male 
lives for a shorter period. The 
adults mate and the females 
begin laying eggs soon after 
emergence. The lemale lays 
50 to 250 eggs. Eggs are de­
posited in the spike lets soon 
after the heads appear from

the boot,Injury to the sorghum 
gram is caused by the larva 
which feeds on tne internal
content of the seed.

Midge emerged from the 
first Johusongr ass head sample 
taken on June 10. From June 
10 to date, nudge have been 
found in L u b b o c k ,  Garza, 
Dawson, H o c k l e y ,  Crosby, 
T e r r y ,  Ly n n , Lamb .Hale, 
Gaines, Floyd and Dickens 
counties. Nudge emergence 
has been noted from several 
host plants including Johnson- 
grass, Sudan grass, Sorghum 
almurti and White Tridens, 
Based upon present findings, 
all indications are that tne 
midjje over-wintered in this 
area.

Tim ing of insecticide ap­
plications is the mutt import­

ant factor in midge control. 
Chemical control is aimed at 
the destruction of the adult 
nudge before egg laying be­
gins. Treatment should be 
made as soon as B0 percent of 
the heads have emerged from 
the boot, but never later than 
three days after emergence. 
There is currently no accurate 
means of predicting an infest­
ation of midge. Previous work 
has shown tnat it is usually 
not profitable to apply chem­
ical control after the nudge 
are found within the sorghum 
field to be treated. The fo ll­
owing insecticides are WCOOW 
mended for midge control:

(1) Endrin-1.6 lbs/gal - U pt. 
acre. Do not apply within 35 
days of harvest. Apply only 
once each season.

(2 ) Toxaphene - tl lbs/ ga l-- 
1/3 to 1/2 cal/acre. Apply 
only once after heads have 
formed. Do not apply over 1/3 
gal/acre within 28 days of 
harvest or over 1/2 ga l l on  
within 4 0 days  o f  harvest. 
Dairy animals or animals being 
finished for slaughter should

not be pastured in toxaphene 
treated fields. Do noi ensile 
in ued linage.

Sevin (805L WP) U to 2i 
e applied

to forage sorghum without
lb% cre  .Sevin may heap 
(0  linage sorghum wli 
limitation. Allow 21 days be­
tween last application and 
harvest of sorghum grain,

PartyUn...
Sunday dinner guests in the 

Bruce Higgins home were Mr. 
and Mrs.noug Higgins, Letha 
and Daniel .Hum, Mt, and Mn. 
Lynn Glasscock, Hoyt and 
Teresa.

Mr.and Mrs.John Adams, of 
near Uvalde,visited with Mn, 
Ann Hodge and other friends, 
Monday morning. The Adams, 
are former Earth residents.

Mr. and Mrs. Buford Price
spent the weekend in Farming- 
ton, New Mexico, with Ins 
brother, the David Prices and 
other relatives.

Program Wednesday night. Mrs.
cna

the program.
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"Boi Oh Snmttft

NYLON

Tooth 
Brushes

 ̂ I9f Each Or

2 for37C „
LIBBY'S

NABISCO
FOR

CRACKERS 
■ 2 9 *1 LB. BOX

REARS 39*

Vimni Sausage
G LAD IO LA

F L O U R
25# Paper Bag

$ 1 7 9

FRESH GROUND

H A M B U R G ER  3 *1
A L L  MCATpRANKS 2 t6 9 C

Stew M e a t^  49C

B E L L P E P P E R S HUNTS

LARGE SIZE 
EACH

BONELESS

FRESH BEEF

PAT IO  FROZEN

-..CONCHO CREAM 
STYLE  GOLDEN

« |C 0 R N  10C
TSi 30 3 Size

KOUNTY KIST

12 O/ Vac Pack

FOR

2 2 O z . B

. . . . . .

Dinners 
39C

JENNIE LEE CUT

Green Beans
,0iC»n 8 *1

T H R IL L  LIQUID

D E T E R G E N T
Bottle 4 9 C

A V O C A D O S
EACH 10C

LE M O N S  ^ C
DEL MONTE SW EET

P IC K LE S
22 Oz. Jar

39C

Fruit Cocktail
303 Can 19C

V E L V E E T A

S '
j t t t t t t l i : :  — ----

ANGEL  SOFT

W H I T E  SW AN

W affle Syrup
“ ° z - 2 9 c

L IV E R

2 # Box

COMET

RIC E4 Roll Pack

2 * Box

L U X  T O IL E T

S O A P
B A T H  S I Z E

2 °2 5 C

Toilet
Tissue

Patterson Bros. 
Grocery &  Market

U N D E R W O O D 'S

Barbecue Beef , package 69C
14


