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Commissioners Seek Solution To Paving Bill Problem
Iam b County com­

missioners, officials from 
the City of Earth, and a 
representative from Jake 
Die! Paving, met in the 
Commissioners' meeting 
room in the lam b County 
Courthouse to discuss the 
debt which was incurred 
with the paving of a county 
road running to the 
Springlake-Earth School.

County Judege Don 
Joyner said, that because 
the court did not approve 
the project, and did not 
advertise for competitive 
bids, the court could not 
legally pay for the more 
than S3.000 debt, although

the county received 

benefits.
However, the Com­

missioners' Court said they 
would place the matter on 
their next meeting agenda, 
to vote on whether they 
would pay for the paving, 
provided a legal way to pay 
for the project could be 
determined.

Jude Joyner advised. “ I 
feel the court will pay the 
debt, if a legal way can be 
found," and again em­
phasized they would have 
to take definite action in 
the next meeting. He said.

“ W ere not obiecting to

payment, if we can do it 
legally. We'd like to get it 
settled."

Earth's city attorney 
Andy Stroebel and County 
Attorney Curtis Wilkinson 
have been working on the 
case, attempting to find a 
legal way to pay the debt, 
and the court is now 
waiting on the Attorney

General's opinion. County 
Attorney Wilkinson ad­
vised he has written the 
Attorney General, asking 
"not for a formal new 
opinion," but an opinion on 
cases already settled on 
similar matters throughout 
the state.

Judge Joyner said, "the 
court feels that the con­
tractor should have seen 
that things were in order" 
before they began doing the 
work.

Warner Lawson, a 
representative from Jake 
Diel s paving, advised they 
could not check out every 
contract because of the 
legal involvement, and he 
said that the contract 
stated that a county road 
was to be included in the 
work

Commissioner Jack 
Peel brought up the 
question of whether one 
governing body could act

streets, the county road 
and the school road at the 
same time. "W e all agreed 
it would be a good idea, and 
I supposed each governing 
body would take care of 
their end of it."

Kelly advised that he 
heard no more about it 
until about a week after 
bids were opened.

Larry Tunnell. who was 
mayor of Earth at that 
time, advised that the 
school board. Clarence 
Kelley and the city council 
had met to discuss the 
paving, and that Kelley 
was later invited to the bid 
opening. "but nobody 
showed up."

for another on advertising 
for bids Judge Joyner 
advised the commissioners 
have to meet, pass an order 
to advertise for bids, and 
advertise before any joint 
action can be taken Judge

Joyner again reminded that 
the Commissioners' Court 
did not know of the paving 
project as a body until they 
received the bill

Doug Parish of Earth 
advised the city had met 
with the school board and 
Commissioner Clarence 
Kelly in a special meeting 
to discuss the joint effort, 
and that a cheaper rate 
could be had by paving city

City attorney atroebel 
asked Commissioner Kelley 
if he was satisfied with the 
paving job. and Kelley said 
he "was not" Kelley 
continued. " I 'l l  take any of 
you out there and show you 
why I'm  not satisfied"

And when Stroebel asked 
him what was wrong, 
Kelley said, "they didn't 
put enough stuff on it."

D iels representative 
said the job was under 
warranty, and "were 
obligated to get the job 
done to specifications."

Earth representatives 
asked if the county could 
take new bids on the

project and in some w#y 
come up with paying for 
the previous job Again, 
the court advised they 
could not, until a legal way 
could be found

Earth officials said they 
"had had more cooperation 

from the court today, thar 
they have had in several 
months, "and they thanked 
the court for hearing their 
side of the situation

Judge Joyner assured 
them, "W e certainly don't 
want to alienate you from 
the rest of the county, and 
we want to do what is right 
to resolve the problem.

Earth Merchants Bank Better Weather Inc. Annual Livestock Show
Association

A drawing was held last 
Saturday to determine the 
winner of the Earth 
Merchants Association 
weekly prizes.

The three winners were 
First. ($751 Mary L. Jones, 
Earth; Second ($501 Bob 
Robinson. Earth; and 
Third ($25) Sandra 
Mclntire. Earth.

The first prize ticket 
was received for purchases 
at the Casual Nook and the 
third place winner was from 
the Market Basket.

Second place prize 
ticket was not named.

This weekly drawing 
will continue to be sup­
ported by the Association, 
and will be accomplished 
each Saturday afternoon

Merchants par­
ticipating in the drawing 
are: White's Auto Store, B 
& L Furniture, T-Bar 
Western Store, Pampered 
Lady, The Daisy. Gary's 
TV Lab. Higgin- 
botham Bartlett. Earth 
Dry G ods, Brock In­

surance Agency, Earth 
Pump and Machine. 
Wolverine Drive-In, Earth 
Feed and Seed. H.S. 
Sanders. Chem-Tex, Earth 
Flower Cart, Carousel Hair 
Design. Market Basket 
Grocery, Q-P Parts, City 
Insurance Agency. Earth 
Ag Supply, Clothes Horse, 
Earth Oil and Gas, 
Wood-Jordan, Beauty Box, 
Casual Nook, Sassy 
Stitchin. John L. Norwood 
Western Pump, Texaco Joe 
Long, Pay-N-Save Grocery, 
Dent Farm Supply and 
Earth NewsSun.

Several names were 
drawn, but unfortunate the 
winners were not present, 
so additional names were 
drawn until a winner was 
determined. Those whose 
names were drawn, but 
were not present were Ray 
Mosley. Sharon Angeley, 
Becky Littleton, Billy 
Homer Hodge. Harvey 
Miller. Donna Neinast, 
Mary Alvarez, Mike West 
and Mary Lou Garcia.

Mary L. Jones First Place Winner

Deposits
Deposits and loans for 

the first quarter of 1977 in 
the eight Lamb County 
area banking institutions 
are up considerably from 
the same period of 1976.

Total deposits are up 
$9,623,713.50 and loans are 
up $8,633,911.71 from the 
January 1-March 31 period 
of last year.

Total deposits on the 
call date were
$116,470,903.50. compared 
to $105,847,190 for 1976

First Federal Savings 
and Loans of Littlefield 
showed savings of 
$31,295,162. up $4,330,020 
from last year's
$26,965,142. Loans were 
$26,125,618, up $3,544,728 
from last year's
$22,580,890.

Deposits at Littlefield's 
Security State Bank 
totaled $26,978,804.39. 
which revealed a net in­
crease of $1,424,806.27 over 
last year's $25,553,998.12. 
Loans and discounts for the 
first quarter of this year are 
$10,455,221.31, a net in­
crease of $870,487.51 over 
last year’s $9,584,733.80.

Olton State Bank 
deposits totaled 
$20,851,868.89. which 
reveals an increase of about* 
$2,230,868.89 over last 
year's $18,621,000. Loans 
and discounts are up 
$1,462,072.45. from 
$13,385,000 to this
quarters figure of
$14,847,072.45.

The First National 
Bank of Littlefield reported 
deposits totaling 
$8,964,342.39 up 
$432,700.66 from last
year's figure of
$8,531,641.73. Loans and 
discounts are up
$1.295 510.12 or from

$2,193,265 26 in 1976 to 
this year's $3,488,775.38.

Citizens State Bank of 
Earth showed deposits of 
$8,536,892.89. up 
$210,892.89 from last

M erchant's Auction
The Earth Merchants 

Association still need 
donations for their auction 
to benefit the Roping Club

Barbecue and other 
projects The auction will 
take place Saturday, April 
23. 7:30 p.m. in the Show 
barn

A partial bat of items to 
be sold follows Shirts and 
other clothes. adding

machine, $20 cash. 1 new 
man s suit, size 40L, 1 new 
(handmade) hackamore. 1 
used washer and dryer,

working condition; 1 used 
refrigerator, 1 used lawn 
mower, runs good; 1 used 
girls bicycle. 1 used boys

bicycle. 40 qts paint, 1 new 
bike, boys; 3 toddler 
horses. 1 toddler running 
roller skate. 1 sandbox with

canapy, 1 play piano, 1 
electric guitar. 1 60 cup 
coffee pot. 1 saber saw. 1 
set heated rollers. 1 case 
Shurfme coffee, 1 used 
couch. 3x3 clamp for 4x4 
bar with shank and foot 
piece. 1x3 clamp for 2 1/4 
bar with shank and foot 
piece. 1 used chair. 1 
dinette table. 2 fireplace 
screens glass. 1 used stero 

and 4 cases oil.

The Better Weather 
Inc. met April 12 to discuss 
the signing of a contract 
with the Atmospherics Inc. 
They also met to count the 
money designated for the 
project.

After all money had 
been recorded, it was 
discovered that there was 
not enough to cover the 
contract's cost, so it was 
not signed

Tom Henderson,
president of the A t­
mospherics Inc., however, 
gave the group until April 
19 to collect enough money 
to sign the contract.

Another meeting has

been scheduled for 
Tuesday. April 19 at 8:00 
p.m. at the Community 
room in Earth to again 
count money and see if 
enough has been paid to 
cover the contract.

Brian Hamilton, 
treasurer of Better 
Weather. Inc. stated 
"People are going to have 
to realize that we can not 
operate without monqy." 
and he urged area farmers 
who have not paid to do so 
by next Tuesday. I f  the 
money is not in to cover the 
contract cost, it will not be 
signed: therefore, there will 
be no program for 1977.

year s $8,325,000. Loans 
are up $720,744 48 from 
$5,957,000 in 1976 to this 
year's $6,677,744 48.

The First National 
Bank of Amherst showed 
first quarter deposits of 
$8,342,311.39 up 
$583,311.39 from last
year's deposits of 
$7,759.00. Loans are up 
$397,704.82 from

$1,455,000 
$1,852,704.82.

The First National 
Bank of Sudan had 
deposits of $5,374,301.97. 
compared to last year's 
deposits of $5,400,496.03, 
down $26,194.06. Loans 
and discounts are up 
$35,190 71 from 
$1,387,120.11 for 1976 to 
$1,422,310.82 for this year.

Sheryl Clayton and Claude Barlow

Citizens Of The Week

This week ■ "Citizens of 
the Week at
Springlake-Earth Junior 
High are Sheryl Clayton 
and Claude Barlow

Sheryl is the 13 year old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Donnie Clayton. She is 
4'11" tall Her favorite 
color ia blue with 
basketball as her favorite 
sport.

Her favorite subject is 
Science and her favorite TV 
Show ia "Baa Baa Black 
Sheep' Her favorite song 
ia "Rich G irl", with 
steak as her favorite food

In the future she would

There was a meeting 
Friday at 7:30 p.m. in the 
showbarn for the annaul 
junior and adult members 
of the Livestock show and 
project

Approximately 150 
people were present at the 
meeting

Refreshments of ice 
cream, and cake were 
prepared and served by the 
FFA  mothers

Board members and 
officers for the livestock 
show and project are. 
President. Richard Bills;

Vice President, Don
Randolph. Co-Secretary. 
Kiddie Sam Jones and 
Bruce Bridges; Board
members are Bob Phipps. 
David Templeton. Dewitt 
Kelley. Dolan Funnell. and 
Wendall Clayton

The new board mem 
bers elected were in­
cumbents, Eddie Sam 
Jones and Bruce Bridges. 
Wendall Clayton was not 
an incumbent

The Junior members 
received their checks for 
the sales of their animals at

the Earth-Springlake 
Junior Livestock Show.

There was a short 
business meeting after the 
general meeting, Officer* 
were elected Possible 
changes for next year's 
stock show were discussed 
and the board decided there
was not a need for any
changes at this time

Plans for the building’s 
new panels were discussed 
It was decided that these 
would be built before next 
year's show

The meeting was tlienr 
adjourned • 4

Melvin Chisum Hands Out Checks At Banquet

like to become an ar- 
chioligists

Claude ia the 13 year old 
son of Mr. and Mr*. C.L. 
Barlow He ia 5'8" tall and 
weighs 130 pounds.

Hia favorite color ia 
purple and his favorite 
sport is football In school 
hia favorite subject is 
Sports with "Buys Bun­
ny Road Runner Hour" as 
his favorite TV  Show

Hamburgers is his 
favorite food and "Detroit 
Rock C ity " as his favorite 
song

In the future he would 
like to become a mechanic

Jim Burgess $ Brian Hamilton

Jim Burgees was the winner of the 40-Channel Cobra CB 
raffled by the Earth Lions Chib Burgess is a past resident 
of Earth and currently lives in Muleehoe. He is employed 

by Fry and Co*.

Picture

Contest

Winners
The votes for the 

pictures, taken on Friday,, 
February 11, have been 
tabulated

Winners for the picture 
contest are as follows:

First Place, goes to 
Dakota Lewis, son of Mr.., 
and Mrs. Kent Lewis.

Second Place, Michelle- 
Winders, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs Mike Winders.

Third place. lairry 
Stovall. Jr„ son of Mr. and 
Mr*. Larry Stovall

The first place winner 
will be presented an 8x10 
Deco Plaque, second place, - 
e com posit (several small 
pictures in frame); third 
place, an 8x10 photo.

Prisee and pictures of 
the winners will be 

* at •  ‘
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Miss Tri-Counly 

Contests Set
fW i/ Lines I^SunnysideNevvs

The Mules hoe Jaycees 
are sponsors of the Miss 
Tri-County and the Little 
Miss Tri-County Contests. 
The combined event 
scheduled for Saturday, 
April 23. 1977 at 7:30 p m 
in the Muleshoe High 
School Auditorium.

Official rules «Jor the 
Miss Tri-County contests 
are: Entrants must be 
between the ages of 15 and 
19. They must complete the 
entry form and include a 
black and white photo of 
themselves with this form

Contestants will be 
judged on: 1. Personal 
interview; 2. Modeling of 
sports wear, 3. Modeling of 
a one piece swim suit; 4. 
Formal wear competition, 
and 5 On state interview 
by question and spon­
taneous answer of the top 
five finalists.

The Little Miss 
Tri-County contestants 
must be between the ages 
of 6 to 11. They will be

judged on 1. Modeling of 
sports wear; 2. Modeling of 
Party Drees, and 3. on 
State interview by question 
and spontaneous answer of 
the top five finalists. They 
also send in a black and 
white photo with entry 
form completed

Entry forms are 
available at St. Clair’s 
Department Store, or the 
Muleshoe State Bank. 
Muleshoe; Amherst Drug, 
Amherst; The Sudan 
Beacon News. Sudan; and 
the Earth News-Sun, 
Earth The deadline for 
entries is Thursday. April 
21 .

Assisting contestants 
will be Tu Tu's School of 
Dance in providing entries 
with instructions of her 
choice such as walking, 
poise, etc.

The Muleshoe Jayceee 
desire entrants to have 
business sponsors, but it is 
not necessary

S C  & F F A  W o rk  

T o ge th e r

The Student Council 
and FFA Clubs of the 
Springlake-Earth school 
are working together on a 
joint project. The clubs will 
sponsor the High School 
Rodeo. Friday. May 20. 
starting at 8:00 p m. in the 
Earth Rodeo Arena.

Admission will be I I  50 
for adults. SI for children 
over 12. and 75 cents for 
children under 12. (Con­
testants will pay admission 
also 1

Entry fees will be 8 1.00 
per person, in spite of the 
number of events entered

Events will be:
I. Steer Riding, 1st 

Section
2 Calf Drataikg-Girta
3. Nesuce Race
4. Barrel Race-Boys & 

Girls
5. 2nd Section Steer 

Riding
6. Greased Pig Race
7. Goat Tying-Girls
8. Women Goat

Dressing
9 3rd Steer Hiding
10. Boy Steer Saddlings
II. Chute 

Dogging Boys
12. Teacher Calf

Tying-Teacher vs J.C.
13. J C  Wild Cow 

Milking

14 Calf Roping-Boys &
Girls

15. Gold Rush 
Points awarded to event

winners:
lst-4 points 
2nd-3 points 
3rd-2 points 
4th-1 point
The exceptions will be 

for the following:
Greased Pig Race-1st 

place-6 points 2nd place-4 
points

Calf Tying-1st place-10 
points.

Gold Rush-1st place-10
points.

The class with the most 
points will be awarded a
trophy

Teacher even U  will be. 
1. Women Goat

Dressing-competition 
between (Elementary. 
Junior High and High 
School teachers)

2 Teacher Calf
Tying-competition between 
teachers and JC's.

3. Wild Cow
M liking-Competition 
between teachers vs JC’s.

A concession stand will 
be run by the Student 
council.

The announcer for the 
Rodeo will be Glenn 
Bran scum

To help them celebrate 
Easter dinner, the Shanks 
Ivy 's  had these visitors, 
Mr and Mrs. Jessie Cole 
and Heath of Lubbock; Mr. 
and Mrs. Claburn Stuart 
and children of Sonora: Mr. 
and Mrs Jerry Schultz, 
Mr and Mrs. Frank Butter 
and Mr Pete Shoup. all of 
Earth.

Mr. and Mrs. R.G 
Parker and their daughter 
Kay of Earth, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clay Mick, Darrell and 
Eddy of Canyon; and Mr. 
and Mrs. Danny Sullivan, 
Brad and John of Canyon 
ate Easter Dinner with the 
Robert Lynn Conner's of 
Springlake.

Mrs. John Welch 
visited with Mrs. Maude 
Stout last Thursday 
evening

Mrs. Fred Welch and 
Mrs. Cecil Slover and 
daughters visited with 
Mrs. Maude Stout Monday 
evening.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
McGuire and family spent 
Easter with her parents, 
the R.D. Ussery s.

Mr. and Mrs. Carlos 
Bills of Lubbock spent 
Monday with Mr and Mrs. 
R.D. Ussery

Mr and Mrs. Lowell 
Walden had guests in their 
home Easter Sunday. Mr. 
and Mrs Darrell Walden. 
Ricky and Karen of 
Muleshoe and Mr and Mrs. 
Gerald Vaughn of Dodd 
went to church with the 
Walden's. Mr. and Mrs. 
Delvin Walden. Kelley and 
Richard of Springlake then 
came and they all ate 
dinner together.

Cliff W ood, from ASU 
in San Angelo came home 
to visit with his family Mr 
and Mrs. Calvin Wood and 
Jennifer.

ot
Mrs Bonnie Haberer 

journeyed to Plainview 
Monday on a business trip.

Visiting in the home of 
the Raiford Daniel's for 
Easter were Mr and Mrs. 
Raiford Daniel I I I .  and 
Gary of Levelland; Mr and 
Mrs. Clifford Daniel. 
Donna Daniel of Lubbock. 
Terry Lively. Debbie. Jodie 
and Albert, all were home 
for the day

By: Teeny Bowden

Brother Jim Eckman. 
pastor of the Earth Church 
of Christ and his family 
were in the Gospel Meeting 
in Lovelady. April 3-8.

Pam Holland went with 
her grandparents, the W P. 
Holland Sr . of Amherst 
and her aunt Mrs. Wilma 
Swindel of Hart to their 
clasa reunion of 1925 in 
Mam ton. Ok la Lena
Sturgess also made the 
trip.

Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Bell and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ricky Bell were in Fort 
Worth Wednesday through 
Saturday with the Dun mitt 
Junior All-Star Little 
Dribbler team They lost 
their second game Friday 
with Friona. They toured 
Six Flags Saturday and 
came home Saturday night

Mrs. Raymond Jones, 
Mrs. David Sadler and 
Mrs. Hershel Wilson at­
tended the Vacation Bible 
School Clinic in Lockney 
Monday.

Charles Axtell, Gerald 
Graham, and L.B. Bowden 
attended the Better 
W'eather Inc. meeting in 
Earth Tuesday night.

Charlie Hall Jones 
qmnsored a barbecue 
supper and program on the 
Southwest corn borer at the 
Community building 
Thursday night

Mrs. Jess Matlock of 
Spnnglake was dismissed 
from St. Mary's Hospital in 
Lubbock Monday, and has 
spent the week with her 
daughter. Mrs. Carl 
Bradley and boys. She went 
home Saturday

Bill Matlock was 
dismissed from Methodist 
Hospital in Lubbock 
Tuesday He will have to go 
back for treatments 
periodically

Mrs. Lynn Cox was 
admitted to Nichols 
Memorial Hospital in 
Plainview Thursday and 
underwent major surgery 
Friday morning

Mr. and Mrs. Chad 
Windsor of Waco arrived 
last Saturday night to spend 
the faster break with her 
parents. M r and Mrs. Tex 
Conard of D unmitt and M r. 
and M rs Larry Sadler. 
Carrie. Stacy and Laura 
Mrs. Sadler. Mrs Windsor 
and the girls went to 
Amarillo Tuesday to bring 
Mr. Conard home ance the 
doctors thought he could do 
the therapy at home The 
Windsors went home 
Thursday.

Howard Cummings was 
transfered from the 
Amherst Hospital to 
Methodist Hospital in 
Lubbock Monday for testa 
He was dismissed Friday

Mrs. Embree Roy 
Sadler received word 
recently that her brother 
Tommie Fowlkes had been 
taken out of his body cast, 
but the cast is still on his 
arm He was dismissed from 
the hospital in Fort Worth 
Saturday

Mrs. Raymond Jones. 
Tammy and Rhonda Rosa, 
and Lynn Brown attended 
the Youth Rally at Lee 
Street Church in Dimmitt

" I  D O N T  R E C A L L  T H E  VET  S A Y IN G  
AN YTH IN G  A B O U T  B R E A K F A S T  IN B E D '"

the earth new9-sun

'"V A S S O C I A T I O N
PuMiWitd at Earth. Taxaa 79031 wary Thursday 
Thursday following Christmas

aespt ths first

Claaa Pnstags paid at Earth. Taxaa_______  * .
SUBSCRIPTION RATE 

Earth and Trad* Territory par yssr 
Flaswhsr* in Unitsd States, par vaar *

M30
r  sa

CLASSIFIED R A H 3  

Taa cants par word. ( I  SO minimum

Ray Fraailman 
Diana Enwdman 
Monda Hamel 
Grace Stovall

Bus Mgr 
Society

CimilatMs

„ SUMMER 
l i  SAVVY..

Summer Sheer $Oflfl 
Panty Hose l

V

Jacques Levine Slippers

Black and White ^ 13 ^
*

We have a good selection of iwimwmr now. but we 
won t have it far long, eo hurry in and make your

Casual Nook
EARTH

Monday nighL They saw 
the film. "Step Over The 
Edge" and had supper 
together.

Baptist M en met 
Tuesday morning for their 
regular monthly prayer 
breakfast

Baptist Women met 
Tuesday morning for the 
missionary program with 
Mrs. Roy Phelan in charge 
of the program.

Baptist Young Women 
met Tuesday afternoon for 
their bi-monthly meeting 
with Mrs. Martin Lefevere. 
president in charge

Mr. and Mrs. Ezell 
Sadler sponsored a Home 
Security System film And 
program in their home 
Monday night J.V. Davis 
of Lubbock gave the 
demonstration

Mrs. Embree Roy 
Sadler worked with 
auxiliary duties at Plains 
Memorial Hospital in 
Dimmitt Monday af­
ternoon

Mrs. Mae Etta Watt* 
and Bubba Jones of Fort 
Worth, and Mrs. Eddie 
Jones. Ray and Darla and 
Wade Jones from San 
Angelo arrived Friday 
afternoon to spend the 
week-end with Rev and 
Mrs. Raymond Jones Mr. 
and Mrs. Ty Jones from 
Hereford and Mr. and Mrs. 
Doyle Bothwell of Plain- 
view <pent the day fkinday 
with them They were all 
visitors in the $kinday 
morning services.

Rev. and M rs. 
Raymond Jones and their 
week-end guests and Lee 
and Lynn Brown, and Gale 
Jones went to the sandhills

Saturday afternoon to clean 
up the site where they 
picniced recently

Notice

It is requested that all 
material purchased at the 
Stevens Auction be 
removed from the premises 
by April 17. 1977, or they 
will be disposed of.

A S v m i t s
trv peT*r

•STATE OF TE X A S  

C O U N TY OF LAM B 
SPR IN G LA K E -E A R TH  

'IN D E P E N D E N T  SCHOOL D IS T R IC T

The Springlake-Earth Independent School Distict 
Board of Trustees adopted the following policies 
regarding chargee for the collection of Delinquent 
Taxes

1. 11.00 chsrgs for sach delinquent receipt 
issued.
4 2. 81.00 charge for each affidavit etc. furnished 

the attorney.
3. Costs of copies of records of other agencies 

necessary when filing suit
4 Fifteen percent (15% I of delinquent taxes end 

penalty to cover cost of legal eervicea.

April 11. 1977 
Pauline Hucks 
Tax Assesoor-Collector

1501 IV. 5th

Stock Reduction Sale
All Frames in Stock

25% OFF
FRAME NOOK

Levi Bells &  Saddleman Jeans
3 Pair For

$2995
Good Size Range

T-Bar Western Store

you re in 
safe waters

WHEN YOU 
SAVE REGULARLY

4
•»

It's smooth sailing 

all the way when you 

put your savings to 

work at a bank that 

knows its business.

That’s us —  we ll steer you to a plan that’s best for your 

individual situation and needs . . .  guide you to a happy 

harbor of financial security. Entrust your ship of fortune 

to us. We ll help you find your treasurel

Citizens State Bank
Earth, Texas-Member F.D.I.C.
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Ice cream and 
Jell-0

HWAN i 1 All**
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w.iut Add I pint v anilla uv cream hy hpmntuU Stir until ict* 
m am i> melted C hill .ilmut I h»*ur h*r 11* * 1’ ups vnd $ I tV to 
The \e\t K*\hi4JellO Rcapc h»i>L l\«t Office IU
K.mkakiv lllih*H>(x*VI
K M O  • »« 1» '<t U  vi l » 4* i  lit il k . 4 t H it I t 4 ,

Q t it tirr.ti 1* * * 1'  K • tffxtMinei I'*,’ ,’

Oops 8 9 1  Tarty d r ies  N otice d n d a  Jam es
The TOPS 891 Club met 

Wednesday for a regular 
meeting Five members 
were present.

Queen for the Week was 
Alma Stockstill.

Members present were 
Birdie Herrtage, Florence 
Cover, Hazel Randolph, 
Alma Stockstill and Jo 
Jones.

7 Day - A  - Week Service 

Is Nothing New For Us 
W e’ ve Been Doing 

It For

25 YEARS
So Put Our Many Years 

Of Experience 

To Work For You

Week-end visitors in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs R.D. 
(Tub) Angeley of Pleasant 
Valley were Kurt Reynolds 
and David McCormick of 
Albuquerque, N.M.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Weldon of Earth, Mr. and 
Mrs Bill Weldon Sr. of 
Midland, Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Martin of Earth ate 
Easier dinner with Mr. and 
Mrs. Perry Martin of 
Earth.

Visiting in the home of 
Mr and Mrs Clifford 
Daniel for Easter were her 
father, grandmother and 
sister, Eddie, Verna and 

I Tuesday Martin, all of 
Oklahoma City. Okla.

There will be a wedding 
shower honoring Jan 
Cleavinger, bride-elect of 
Randall Leonhard. 
Saturday, April 23 in the 
home of Mrs. C.C. 
Goodwin, Jr.

Hours are from 2:30 to 
4:30 p.m.

Everyone is invited.

N otice
Mr. and Mrs. David 

Crane will be honored with 
a miscellaneous wedding 
shower. Sunday, April 17 
at 7:00 p.m. in the 
Fellowship Hall of the First 
Baptist Church in Earth 

Hosts are the Young 
Adult 1 and 2 classes. 

Everyone is invited.

QYlr. and Qlflr$. $ '. £j$. 0 c 

request Hie honour o f your presence 

at the marriage of their daughter 

J^inda ^Ylflagoline

to

The Lona Green Line .. 
Leadership in 
product and service, 
today and tomorrow. Call Us Anytime

DENT FARM SUPPLY
IA-, -a •YCYUR JOHN D ITERE “D IA L E R  IN  E A R T H ’

fyYlr. cJOfttty CDuchworth 

m (Saturday, the aixieenlh of $\pri\ 

Qlineteen hundred and eeventyseven 

at eeven-lhirty in the evening

0 iri l £$aptisl (Church 

G^pringlahe, 0 exa*

<̂Reception following the ceremony

Oil change for 
small change.

Regular Gas, Unleaded Gas And Diesel Keys Available

Earth Oil & Gas Co., Inc.
OWNERS

VERRY and M ARVIN BEEN

Phone 267-3461— Earth

Honored 

With Shorter
Linda James, bride-elect 

of Sonny Duckworth, was 
honored with a bridal 
shower, Saturday. April 9 
in the home of Mrs. Steve 
Busby.

Jennifer Pellham. 
registered guests

The serving table, 
covered with a white floor 
length cloth, was centered 
with an arrangement of 
blue tapers and flowers, 
with accent of the bride's 
colors, which were blue, 
pink, yellow and green

Refreshments of dainty 
sandwiches. Texas cream 
snowballs, pineapple slush 
punch, mints and coffee 
were served by Mrs Steve 
Busby and Cathy AUiaon of 
Clovis. N.M.

Hostesses gifts in­
cluded 2 leather chairs on 
rollers, tablecloth, bath set. 
cookware set and assorted 
pieces of her selected 
dishes

Out of town guests were 
from Olton. Kress. 
Plainview. Paducah. Clovis 
and Amarillo

Hostesses for the event 
were Mrs Hollis Cain. Mrs. 
Roy Byers, Mrs. Steve 
Busby. Mrs. Jimmy Banks. 
Mrs. James Sanderson. 
Mrs James Busby. Mrs 
L.G. W’atson, Mrs Fred 
Smith. Mrs. J.P. Gibson. 
Mrs. Harlon Watson. Mrs 
Donnie Clayton. Mrs Bill 
Clayton. Mrs. Ricky Byers 
and Mrs James Packard

Also Mrs Danny 
Byers. Mrs Orville Drake. 
Mrs. B.V. Padon. Mrs Veo 
Busby. Mrs Donald 
Kelley. Mrs K B Parish. 
Mrs. John Bridges, Mrs 
Ernest Green, Mrs 
Gay land Stephens. Mrs 
Almon Whitford. Mrs. 
1 Aden Fennell. Mrs Myrtle 
Clayton and Mrs. Leta 
Kelley.

TOMMY CLAYTON and DONNA SMITH

!Engagement Announced
Mr and Mrs James 

Smith announce the 
engagement and ap­
proaching marriage of their 
daughter Donna. to
Tommy Clayton, son of Mr 
and Mrs Billy Wayne
Clayton of Springlake 

Donna is a candidate for 
graduation from 
Springlake-Earth High

School in May.
Tommy attended school 

at Springlake-Earth.
graduating from Littlefield 
High School in 1974. and is 
presently farming

The couple will be 
married June 24th.

The couple will be 
married June 24th, in the 
home of his parents

S aby  Shorter-Taster Tarty

M k  luxrdo A  Tuxedo £ k  

^  Rfinal /J R «la l W

THE PROM...

TTHE OCCASION DEMANOS 
BLACK TIE ...
YOU DESERVE IT

Choose from a htowhooling 
inventory of Stylos. . . .  
colors....and fabrics.

Tailored with today's look 
oleosa.

Tuxedo Rental
' ONE-HOUR 

MARTINIZING
149 N. 25 Mils Art 
364-4720 
Closed Saturdays

#  HEREFORD R 
luxrdo A  Taxrdo 

Rental Ju Rental

R

t
_______________)  f

f  Tuxedo Ak
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Mr and Mrs. Dean 
Jones hosted a baby 
shower/Easter party for 
her sister and husband. Mr 
and Mrs Bill Gover of 
Plainview

The party started with 
an Easter hunt for the 
children.

Dinner followed with 
hamburgers and all the 
trimmings, with homemade 
ice cream for desert

The shower table was 
covered with a white 
labWrloth An F.aster egg 
tree served for the cen­
terpiece The tree, flaked 
with Easter bunnies, had a

g o ’s -D o

(gardening
On Wednesday. April 

6. the G A. Girls held their 
regular weekly meeting

The girls did some 
gardening around the 
church, hoed weeds and 
cleaned around the 
building.

Due to the Revival 
being held next week, the 
girls will not hold their 
regular meeting, but will 
meet that night and sit 
together at the Revival.

Refreshments of in­
dividual ice cream cups was 
served by Beverly Walden.

Members attending 
were Wendy Kniffen. Janie 
Moree, Kelley Walden. 
Cathy Cain. Connie Cain 
and leader Beverly Walden

baby dressed in blue un­
derneath it in an Easter, 
rgg

There was an assort 
ment of gifts presented for 
the baby

Assorted breads and 
cakes were served

Those attending the 
shower party were Mr. and 
Mrs Bill Gover, Jeffrey 
and Velvet of Plainview. 
Mr and Mrs. Jim Ferguson 
and Julie of Olton. Mr and 
Mrs Jo (  heater of Olton; 
Mrs EC. Hudson of 
Earth, and the boots and 
hostesses, Mr and Mrs. 
Dean Jones. Tamara. Tony. 
Lezlee, and Lara

Card O f  

Ohanhs
1 wish to express my 

sincere appreciation to all 
my friends for all the kind 
deeds done for me during 
my stay in the hospital and 
my recovery at home Your 
prayers, visits. cards, 
flowers and words of en 
couragement meant so 
much to me

May God bless you.

Mrs Lucille Matlock

FH'A S a k e
Sale

Mr. A Mrs. David Crane

Will be honored with a 
shower Sunday, April 17 at 
7:00 p.m. at the First 
Baptist Church.

Mr. & Mrs. Crane have 
made selections at

O he ‘D aisy .mi Sassy Stitchin

EARTH

The FHA girls received 
approximately 4150 from 
their bake sale, which was 
held Saturday. Apnl 9 at 
the Bee Hive Mall

Money received will be 
given to the Cancer Drive

T V  Social 
Club M eet
The Pleasant Valley 

Social Club held their 
meeting Thursday. April 7 
in the home of Mrs. Enos 
Galyon

Since no program was 
planned, the time was 
spent visiting and working 
on summer plans

Delicious refreshments 
were served to the 
following present. Mrs. Joe 
Embrey. Mrs Bonnie 
Haberer. Mrs. Lillie 
Wuerflein. Mrs. B.H. 
Pickel and hostess. Mrs. 
Enos Galyonm

htVMnv that tart.
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'Birthday &-> Anniversary
Local people celebrating April 17

their birthday or an- Cathy Cain
niversary from April 14 to Fvanel Winders 
April 20 are as follows:

Representatives of the 
Spring lake-Earth Future 
Homemakers of America 
Chapter will be attending 
the 1977 state meeting of

talent show featuring 
representatives from Area 
VI-X. The theme of the 
show ia "People are 
Shining Stars.”

Future Homemakers 
who have achieved unusual 
accomplishments by
completing all levels of 
Encounter, a special 
growth and development 
program, will be honored at 
breakfast Friday morning.

A state choir, composed 
of 130 Future 
Homemakers. will be 
featured. John Scarcella, 
music director of 
Cypress- Fairbanks 
Schools, will lead the 
group.

Installation of the 
1977-78 state officers will 
climax the Friday evening 
session A t this time, 
eleven officers elected 
through chapter par­
ticipation throughout the 
state will be placed in 
office. A newly elected 
president will receive the 
gavel from Phyllis Cicero. 
Tyler. Texas, outgoing 
president

The Future 
Homemakers of Amenca is 
a vocational youth 
organization sponsored by 
Homemaking Education, 
Texas Education Agency, 
with Mrs Elizabeth F 
Smith, director, and Mrs 
Betty Romans. stale 
advisor

April 18 
Tamara D. Jones
Johnny Smith

B IR TH D A Y
Texas Association of FH A  
along with over 6,000 
.members and advisors from 
across the state.

“ Shaping an Unfinished 
W orld" ia the theme of the 
1977 meeting, which will be 
held in the Astroarena. 
Houston, on April 21-22.

Attending from 
Springlake-Earth will be 
Alayne Stover. Area I, 1st 
Vice President; delegates. 
Pam Ott and Connie Dear; 
Encounter 111, Shem 
Winders and Kim Jones

Entertaining and 
challenging Dan McBride 
from Jacksonvdle. Texas, 
will set the meeting theme 
on Friday morning Joseph 
Sorrentino. gang leader 
turned US. Juvenile 
Judge, will inspire the 
group to greater individual 
achievement in the Friday 
night session

Workshops on topics of 
concern to young people 
such as child abuse, family, 
and values wdl highlight 
the meeting

The business of the 
Texas Association will be 
conducted at the House of 
Delegates session Thur­
sday evening, followed by a

April 14
Tammy Fulenwider 
Mary Pyle April 20

Karen Robinson 
Julie Templeton 
Estelle Bearden 
Macky McCarty 
Michael Smith

April 15 
Linda Hill

April 16 
Evelyn V'erden

COW POKES

S -  ‘E  Seniors Honored
The Earth Catholic 

Church sponsored a lun­
cheon for the Seniors of 
Springlake-Earth High 
School Monday, April 11.

The menu consisted of 
enchiladas, tamales, frijoles 
ala charra. Spanish rice, 
roast beef, salad, jello. cake 
and punch

by Mrs. Julia Samaniego. 
The centerpiece was a white 
flowers arrangement

A souvenir presented to 
each Senior by the ladies of 
the church was a harredo 
Mexicano with a blue 
tassel, representing the 
graduating caps

Thirty eight seniors 
were present for the lun­
cheon Teachers present 
were Bill Mann. 
Superintendent. Bob May, 
High School Principal; 
Mrs Marie Slover and Bill 
Anderson, sponsors

Ladies cooking the meal

were. Mrs. Linda Duran, 
Mrs. Helen Ramirez. Mrs. 
Lucy Monreal, Mrs. 
Rosemary Monreal. Mrs. 
Adelita Garza. Mrs.
Virginia Soto, Mrs. Juanita 
Castillo. Mrs. Frances 
Acala. Mrs. Julia Fuentes, 
Mrs. Hovita Fuentes. Mr. 
and Mrs. Delgado of 
Bovina. Mrs. Corine
Gallegos, Mrs. Delores
Flores. Mrs. Julia
Samaniego. and Miss 
EStella Fuentes.

The priest was unable 
to attend because of an 
illness.

The teachers' table was 
covered with a white 
tablecloth with em­
broidering saying 
Spnnglake-Earth School 
Seniors '77. The stitching 
was in blue and handmade

H D  ‘District M eetingMr and Mrs. Kent 
Coker and Jo Ann and Mr 
and Mrs Bob Coker and 
sons ate Easter dinner with 
the J.J Coker's.

The Home Demon­
stration District meeting 
was held last Thursday, 
April 7 at the Baptist 
Church in Levelland

Mrs. Roy (Anita) Bass 
from Lubbock was guest 
weaker Her subject was on

The United Methodist 
Women met Monday. April 
11 at 7:30 pm . at the 
church. They continued 
their study on Mark with 
Mrs Melton Welch 
teaching

Those attending were 
11a Mae Haydon. Mrs Ed 
Dawson. Mrs John Breck, 
Mrs. M elto i Wek-h. Mrs 
Lena Grace Giffm. Mrs. 
Jerry Been. Mrs Burl 
Hamilton. Mrs Norman 
Sulsar. Mrs W P Holland. 
Jr and Mrs Bud Matlock.

April 5-Adm Mrs
Emelia Garza. Mrs. Mane 
Payne. Dism: Mr Ray 
Blessing. Mrs Ola Baccus.
Mrs. Naomi Solley

April 6. Adm: Mrs.
Aida Slate. Mrs. Mary 
Helen Sanchez. Mrs Addis 
Williams. Mrs. Genevieve 
Lopez. Mrs Bill Loe 
Dism Mr Joe Trevino.
Mrs Deha Baccus 

Apnl 7-Adm/Rone Dism:
M iss Tammie Trotter 

April 8 Adm none
Dism none.

April 9. Adm Terry 
Tennyson Dism none

April 10 Adm: Miss
Doris Tucker. Luke 
Swart. Dism. Mrs June 
Armistead. Mrs. Emdia 
Garza.

April 11 Adm H I.
Sherly, Mrs Teresa 
Pedrora. Mrs. Lucy 
Cantrell Dwm none.

C R O S S W O R D
A rso n s  l  c w t  ,T -----n  abort

The J.A Gover's spent 
Easter with her parents. 
Mr and Mrs H.H Foster 
of Littlefield

There were 47 
delegates. 22 agents. 3 
retired agents and 189 
visitors in attendance

The scholarship, 
presented to the most 
deserving, was presented to 
Annette Wells from Hale 
County.

Entertaining for the 
event were the "Bakers 
Dozen", from South Plains 
College

The next District 
meeting will be held in 
Dimmitt in the Spring of
1978.

Those attending from 
the local club were M rs 
Bruce Higgins. Mrs. l>eon 
Foster. Mrs. Bob Boone, 
Mrs. Keith Boone and 
Melanie Boone.

Your mog.rtofton con ploy Havoc with you brooding 
•  ill get raw , Think poativafyl

Frivolity leant to be u*mo»t Htii - • « *  Toke hm* 
and r*oily enjoy yaurtalf. THe tan owl tHi ng» will be 
•acond.

Spnngiake
Sunnyside

RT.1

DIM M ITT, TEX. 79027

PRAYING 3fe- SERVICE 
Owner. Charlie H.Jones

Mr. and Mrs Kent 
Coker. JoAnn of Lubbock 
and Mr and Mrs Victor 
Coker. Valene and 
Shannon spent Easter with 
Mrs Beula Coker

Don't tr, to ryn the •hole thpm Not only it .1 in 
possible bvt it could be hotordous to youi heolth

Custom
Farm ing

Flatbreaking
Chiseling
Disking
Leveling
Listing

AUts'a low* 34 A! homr 
Chsttar IS Cry out W elding

Portable Welding 
Hardsurfacing 
Drillpress Work 
Press 30 Ton 
Lathe Small Work

Harvesting

Com
Milo
Soybeans
Wheat
Cotton

sho«ed *ith  older folks 
Helping yourself

N o *  it the time to give o great deal o* thought 
your future. You con tuccaod if you are •illin  
moke sacrifice*

We Have Tool Bars 
Single, Double, Triple

2 1/4", 4". 4x7" 5x7"

It A clergyman 
SI Mu»c not,
IS SAl
13 M ak  atoap
St Fruiting 

apika o f 
grain 

IS Fat bar 
IS A abiaM 
40 miiirlaa 
43 S ilrat 
43 Iron ar  gold

SHOCK
ABSORBERS

Mechanic
S a w : Clamps

Chemical’s

flat & row's

Rolling Cultivator

6/8x2" 
5/8x2”  

3/4x2 1/2 
3/4x2 1/2 
3/4x2 1/2

I.H.C. #500 Planter 3/4x2 1/2

Anhydrous Ammonia
Planting Maxi*MergeExtended clamps All Sizes a 

Tool Bar Spacer's AU SizesShank's

Cotton Trailer Beds 

IRR Well Drive Shaft Shields
5/8x2" 
3/4x2 1/2 
1 x 3 ”  
1 x 3 ”

$15.99 ea. Needlepoint canvases 
at wholesale prices.
TiMaisasmcM'itar
lw i lM 4 « « a a iM  ANYKA
t E S T i S ” '  NEEDLEPO INT, IN C
AmnncnrS a*V Anwnean
n e w  ■ « * -  —  121 E a s t 57th  S tre e t
S & Z T t H J T  M aw  Y o r k , N Y  10022

Hinson IncKnifa attachment 
For l ''x 3 "  Shank

2 Mile* East A I /2 North Of 
Springlake-Karth School*Office 986-3331

The Di-Gel 
Difference
Anti-Gaa im>di( inr 
Di-Gel adds to its 
soothing Ant*4 ids
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What’s Cooking At School

CUSTOM FARMING
8-Row Cultivating 

and
Planting

P lo w in g  &  M a rv e llin g

Contact
Eddio Alair

986-3351 Springlake
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April 18 thru 22 

M ONDAY
Barbeque Beef on Bun 
French Fries 
Ureen Lima Beans 
Peach Upside Down Cake 
Milk

TUESD AY 
Mexican Casserole 
Creamed Corn 
Jello Salad 
Apricot Cobbler 
CornBread & Butter 
Milk

W EDNESDAY 
Roast & Gravy 
Crvamed Potatoes

Relieves Pain 
and Itch of 
Hemorrhoidal
Tissues
l>nHaplh. Irmporirilv in nun* rases.
There* a  medication that re 
I levin occasional hemorrhoidal 
svmptoms within minutes 
Then it lines hevond soothin*. 
actually helps »h n n h  swellinn 
o| hemorrhoidal tissues due 
to inflammation The name 
P re p a ra t io n  H

lioclor tesltsl Preparation H. 
with its earlualve formula is 
America s leading hemorrhoidal 
remedv by far Ointment or 
sup|Misitories

Green Beans
Doughnuts
Hot Rolls & Butter
Milk

TH U RSD AY 
Fried Chicken & Gravy 
Whole New Potatoes 
Blackeyed Peas 
Ice Cream Cups 
Coconut Cake 
Hot Rolls & Butter 
Milk

FR ID A Y
Corn Dogs-Mustard 
Potato Chips 
Carrot & Celery Sticks 
Peanut Butter Crackers 
Strawberry Shortcake 
Milk

!Party £ines
Vivian Parish. Jeanette 

O'Hair and Leta Kelley 
went to Plainview 
Saturday to viait Leta's 
sister. Mrs. Winnie Huff.

Mr and Mrs. Kay 
Kelley spent Thursday 
through Monday enjoying 
themselves in delightful 
weather in a cabin in 
Riodosa

Used Cars & Pickups"!

i 
i  
i 
i  
i  
i  
»

1974 Chevrolet Pickup .1 4 Ton Fully Equiped 

19.4 3 4 ton Pickup 4 wheel Drive

1970 Turquoise Impala Fully Loaded

1975 White Mercury (.rand Marquis Brougham 
Fully Loaded

1974 White Mercury. 2 door, fully loaded

Must Turn These 
At Once 

See Us Now

227-20.10

Randy Johnson 
Chevrolet I

4 — H Home 
Club Meet

The 4 H Horse Club 
held their meeting. 
Monday, April 11 at 8 p.m 

The members voted to 
get matching saddle 
blankets.

Wendy Branscum 
presented John Bridges 
with a plaque for the 
help he has given whenever 
called upon

They practiced western 
pleasure, barrels, flags and
reining.

The District 2 Horse 
Judging Contest for Junior 
and Senior members will be 
held Saturday. April 16 at 
the Livestock Pavillion of 
the Fairgrounds in Lub­
bock Juniors attending are 
W alker Brooks. Littlefield; 
Carla Taylor, Earth; Vonda 
Stephens. Earth, and Gary 
Kidds, Sudan

Seniors are Gary 
Brownd. Sudan; John 
Chester. Sudan; Dina Jo 
Hampton. Hart; and Dawn 
Branscum. Muleshoe

Dates of 6 county 
Playday Horse Shows are: 

May 7-Hereford 
May 21-Castro County 

May 28-Oldham County 
June 4-Bailey County 

June 18-Parmer County 
July 16-Lamb County 
Members present were 

Carla Taylor, Carman 
Taylor. Danny Taylor.
Allen Clayton. Petra Lewis. 
Michele McCarty. Sam 
Lewis, Sheryl Clayton. 
Vonda Stephens. Sharman 
Stephens. Shawndi 
Geissler. Mitzi Dutton.
Ricky Dutton. Clifford
James. Teresa Ott. Steve 
Shepard. Joe Cornett. 
Duke Hampton. Tommy 
Hampton. Dina Jo 
Hampton, Came Dawn 
Been. Jen Paige Been. 
Wendy Branscum, Dawn 
Branscum. Danny Ran 
dolph. Darcy Randolph and 
l>esa Templeton.

Dallas Henderson, her 
son Justin. Mrs. Grace 
Stovall and Carla were in 
Clovis Friday afternoon 
shopping.

irrigation Engines

- *1595
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! 30% Off |
*  5
* On All Easier Items$
J *
* Thursday, Friday J
$ *
J and Saturday Only J
*  ftI  ;
{ Buy  An Easter Lillie I
*  J
I 30% Off *
*  §

{  And Get
*

f io% off
#  #

}  On Any Houseplant {

Hill jlis l 1.85 ill n i s r lots
Etvilk Flowe/t
Owner-Diant Wilson 267

Stan Byrnes 
Ford

Try our new Ultra Moist I
1

Arid PH Balance Permanent j  

By Dermitics

This weeks winner of a free haircut is the 

J.C. Matlock family

d i m m i t t

V  M w * * *

d i m m i t t

•  17 *2115

! * ♦ *
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Seminar “Citing “P ro o f'
In

Lubbock
A seminar “ Institute in 

Basic Youth Conflicts”  was 
held at the Memorial 
Center in Lubbock the past 
week

Bill Gothard is the 
instructor for these 
seminars that have been 
held in large cities across 
the nation and Canada 
during the past several 
years.

3,506 people registered 
for the 32 hour study that 
touched on many areas of 
life, such as self image, 
responsibility, authority, 
personal rights. moral 
freedom, purpose in life, 
friendships, finance,
conscience. marriage, * 
dating, children and the 
principles in applying the 
many Bible Scriptures to 
these areas of life

Approximately 25 from 
Earth Baptist. Earth 
United Methodist and 
Springlake Baptist at­
tended

The seminar will be held 
next year in Lubbock 
Municipal Coliseum March 
27-April 1.

Anyone interested in 
attending other than 
Lubbock can get a schedule 
at the various churches as 
other seminars are 
scheduled through the U.S 
and Canada for '78

Party Cines
Dinner guests in the 

home of Mr and Mrs. 
Donnie Henderson and 
Justin Flaster Sunday were 
Mrs. Grace Stovall and 
children. Garland. Jr.. 
Dusty and Carla Marie 
Also Mike Wimberley. 
Terry Blanton and Tom 
Waller. After a delicious

“ Living Proof” , an 
unparalled $1.5 million 
media evangeliam cam­
paign featuring testimonies 
by well-known personalities 
such as Houston Oiler Billy 
“ White Shoes” Johnson; 
actor Dean Jones; former 
militant Eldndge Cleaver; 
country and western super 
stars Jean me C. Riley and 
Connie Smith; successful 
businessman Allan Mayer 
of Oscar Mayer Company; 
Mias Teenage America, 
Rebecca Ann Reid; 
Kosargentina Pinel. Consul 
General of the Republic of 
Honduras; former band 
leader Paulino Bemal. and 
Antonio Mendoza of the 
U.S. Office of Equal 
Employment who have 
experienced changed lives 

• through commitment to 
Jesus Christ is being 
funded by Texas Baptists 

Large number of 
professions of faith have 
marked the first wave of 
media saturation and 
revival meetings since the 
campaign began February 
21 in North Texas Ac­
cording to a recent issue of 
the Baptist Standard 
many persons have 
responded to the "L iving 
P ro o f testimonies by 
writing to Box 1000. 
Dallas. Texas 75221. The 
primary response, however, 
is expected to come from 
local Baptist churches and 
people who have ex­
perienced "L iving Proof ” 

West Texas saturation 
began March 28. and 
churches in the area are in 
the process of holding 
revivals to climax the 
campaign In the Ear- 
th-Spnnglake area. Baptist 
Churches scheduling
revival meetings in con­
nection with this campaign 
include the First Baptist 
Church of Springlake

Mrs. S 

Honored On
dinner, the rest of the 
afternoon was spent in 
playing games, then the 
group watched the movie 
Jesus of Narareth
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‘Birthday

Mrs J.E. Shirey was 
honored with $ birthday 
coffee. Tuesday, April 5 at 
2:30 in the afternoon in the 
home of Mrs Venona Lee 
Co-hostess for the event 
was Mrs Beula Coker 

Refreshments of Hors 
d oeu'res. Angel food cake 
topped with strawberries 
and whip cream, nuts, 
mints and coffee were 
severed to the following 
people attending, the 
honoree. Mrs. J.E. Shirey. 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Rutter. Mrs Jeol Jones. 
Mrs Lillian Hamilton. 
Mrs Beula Coker and Mrs 
Venona Lee

“New Location”
20%

Off On All Items

Ms & M ’s 
Tall & Stout Shop

44 1/2 Main ,
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Virginia Turner visited 
with Mrs. Copeland.

Mildred Hevern visited 
Mrs. Slate

Mr. and Mrs C.E 
Nichols were here visiting 
Mrs. Smith.

Mr. and Mrs Willie 
Terral and his sister visited 
with Mrs Fife, Mrs Slate 
and Mrs. Smith

Sherry. Kim and Jeanne 
Hay don, Wylene
Cleavinger and Lynn 
Watson visited with Mrs. 
Stine and Lelia Coffer.

Mr and Mrs Bums. 
l)eiia and Lisa Keppel were 

visiting Mrs Jones.

Roy Hilliard and Nell 
Blank urship visited Mr.
Gunn.

*»I*R1L 14, 1977

O irU  Little 

Dribblers

The girls Little 
Dribblers met to play 

I Thursday, April 7 in the 
| high school gym.

In the minor league, the 
Red team coached by Billie Cheryl King and Michael 
Fields, competed against Fields, both with 8 points

The other game played 
Thursday night was the 
Light Blue team coached 
by Jina Bradley vs the Red 
team coached by Jimmy 
Herring

The Blue team
22 - 1 1 .

High

won

scorers were

Mr and Mrs. 
Berry visited Susie

Alex

Mrs Floyd visited with 
Mr Floyd.

Julie Templeton visited 
with Mrs Stine and Lelia 
< offer

Mrs Charlie Nichols 
and Chad from Houston 
were here Friday visiting 
Mrs Smith.

Suzanne and Jill Reid 
visited with Mrs Fife and
Mr Gunn

Hershall and Flora 
Gunn visited Mr. Gunn

Mrs J W Olds visited 
with Mrs. Smith

Kenneth Midelton 
visited Mr. Floyd.

Mr. and Mrs Clois 
Tomes visited with Mrs 
Tomes.

Mrs Sam Cowan, and 
Mr and Mrs Fli Young 
visited with all the 
residents.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Kasten were here for their 
weekly Bible Study

Norman Patton was 
here for Methodist services.

Lynn Blair and Bill 
Johnson were here for 
Church of Chnst Services.

Evelyn Ritchie. Sudan, 
and her daughter. Mrs.
I >ebhie Phillips and 
Christie o f Lubbock visited 
recently with Etta Jones. 
Hattie Doss. F.ffie Yearh, 
la»lia Coffer and others

the Blue team . coached by 
Phil Ninast The Red team 
won 16-8.

High scorer for the 
game was Cathy Pyle

Scoring for the Red 
team were Jeri Cate Fields. 
2 points. Cathy Pyle, 10; 
Kelley Huckabev. 2; and 
Joelda Garza. 2.

Scoring for the Blue 
team were. Mitzi Dutton. 2 
points and Angela Parish. 
6.

The other minor league 
game played was the 
Yellow team coached by 
David Metcalf and the 
Light Blue team, coached 
by Carolyn Stephens

The Blue team won 
16-2.

High scorer was 
Rosalinda Monteal with 8 
points.

Scoring for the Yellow 
team was Vicki King with 2 
points

Scoring for the Blue 
team; Jen Been. 2 points; 
Tracy Murray, 2; Sharman 
Stephens. 4. and Rosalinda 
Monteal. 8.

In the major league, the 
Dark Blue team coached by 
Harold Britton battled 
against the Yellow team 
coached by Jana Parish

The blue team won 
27-14.

High scorer was Vonda 
Stephens with 14 points

Scoring for the Blue 
team were Vonda Stepehsn. 
14 points: Tracy Larky. 11 
points, and Belinda Scott.
2 points.

Scoring for the Yellow 
team were Joy Parish. 6 
pomta; Dara Diudder 2: 
and Lisa Huckabev. 6 
points ________________

Scoring for the Blue 
team was Cheryl King, 8 
points. Michael Fields. 8; 
Elaine Vaughn,2; and 
Denise Price. 4.

Scoring for the Red 
team was Glenda James, 6 
points. Carman Kelley. 3 
points and Cindy 
Fullenwmder. 2 points.

In the Tuesday night 
games, the minor leagues 
Blue team coached by Phil 
Nmast competed against 
the Yellow team, coached 
by David Metcalf

The blue team won 12-8. 
Players scoring for the 

blue team were high scorer. 
Angie Parish. 10 points; 
Barbara Pustos. 2 For the

Yellow team. Vicki King, 2 
points; and Page Layman.
6.

The Light Blue team, 
coached by Carolyn 
Stephens, played against 
the Red team, coached by 
Billie Jean Fields

The Red team won 
14-12

High scorers were 
Rosalinda Montetl and Jeri 
Cate Field, both with 6 
points.

Scorers for the blue 
team were Jeri Been. 2 
points. Rosalinda Monteal, 
6; Sharman Stephens. 4. 
For the Red team. Kelley 
Huckabey, 2 points; Jeri 
Cate Field. 6; Joelda 
Garza. 4; and Cathy Pyle, 
2.

In the major league, the 
blue team coached by 
Harold Britton played the 
Red team coachedby 
Jimmy Herring.

The red team won 13-12.
High scorer was 

Belinda James. 13 points.
Scoring for the Blue

Team was: Vonda
Stephens. 7 points; Tracy 
1-acky, 4; and Belinda 
Scott. 1. Scoring for the 
Red team was Belinda 
James, 13.

The other major league 
game was the Yellow team 
coached by Jana Parish 
against the Light Blue 
team coached by Jima 
Bradley

The light blue team won
48-13.

High scorer was Darcy

Randolph with 13 points, 
for the Yellow team.

Scoring for the light 
blue team was Theresa 
Fullenwider,8 points Elaine 
Vaughn. 6; Michael Fields, 
10; Denise Price 10; and 
Cheryl King, 12.
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Quality Cleaning 
At A Fair Price 

Carpet Cleaning

C& O  Cleaners
628 Forwell A ve. 
L IT T LE F IE LD

S h ir ’s Shantu
7 2 0  B r o a d w a y  P L A IN V IE W

Quality Used and New Furniture
• 225111 

*19900 

4 7901

A *0 j Y*>o CAij AuaX W f 
U£$pc# rr----

JOHNSON

n  k n it i  kk

2 10 4 A m e r ic a n  

Mu lc s boo

272 4115

See Brown Seed Co.

For Your Seed Needs!!
3 Varieties of Sweet Corn

All types of garden seed, Trojan Brand

corn and milo. Certified 

Rilcot Cotton Seed.

Let me know your seed needs.

I f  haven’t got-will get!!

Brown Seed Co.
In Trade Center Building 

East of Dinner Bell

2015 W. American Blvd. Muleshoe, Texas

1 Only 

Captains 

Bed-4 Drawer

HL’S TV & APPLIANCE 
SERVICE

305 W. 4th. l i t t l e f i e l d  385-6176 

HUBERT LINGNAU, Owner

Fast, Professional Service On Mont Color 
Black & White Makes & Models

Matching 5 Drawer Chest

1 Only 7 pc. Colonial Dinette Suite-Pine Finish

1 Only Red Velvet Spanish Love Seat

Stop and See
Our New Selection Of Antiques And Collectables

*199011 

*159.'"

Let L s  Help You Save Money
Gat Maximum Uaa O f Irrigation Water 

And A g  Chemical* W ith

WEX
Nutrient Release Agent 

Applird Pre-Plant U ith Hrrbiridr.
Or Fertilizers

Save Fuel Coats And 
Coatly Repairs With

Conklin Quality Lubricants 
&

Conditioners
Company Trained, A g  Onented

Free Delivery &  Fast Service

Tom Alair 
Eddie Alair 
‘ Bear’ ’ Denton

986-3261
986-3351
257-2048

Earth

Purr.«.fect
Nite Watcher— 
Electric Ready-Lite

1 . Special price until May 31 1977

2 .  Safety & security light where you new it

3.  Automatic on it night off by day

4. Dependable of course it s electric

5 .  Wise energy user pennies a night

6.  Complete normal installation

7 .  Durable heavy cast aluminum

8. Long life bulb 8 000 hour rated

9 .  Put it on your electric bill

■ n.iis.ir.,.1

'7 &
m L M c rv n c

WM

Southern Baptists in Texas want to share 
their 'Living Proof with you.

Fall I hr Baptist Church near you for information.
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Obituaries

Amelia Robles
Serviced for Amelia R. 

Robles, 80, of Earth were at 
2 p.m. Friday at the 
Spanish Church of Christ in 
Earth with Carlos 
Escamilla, minister o f­
ficiating.

Burial was in Earth 
Cemetery under the 
direction of Par 
sons-Ellis-Singleton 
Funeral Home of Earth.

Mrs. Robles died 
Tuesday in Medical Arts 
Hospital in Littlefield.

She was born in Mexico, 
and was a Catholic.

Survivors include two 
sons, Jesus of Muleshoe 
and Robert of Earth; a 
sister, Mrs. Julia Puente of 
San Juan; a brother, 
Ramon Lopez of loaho; six 
grandchildren and 12 
great-grandchildren.

Ocia Mote
LE V E LLAN D  

(Special) — Services for 
Mrs. Ocia Ruth Mote, 40, 
of Levelland were at 4 p.m. 
Tuesday in the First 
Baptist Church here with 
the Rev. J. Prentiss 
McGee, pastor of the First 
Baptist Church here, and 
the Rev. Fred D. Blake, 
pastor, of South Plains 
Baptist Church in South 
Plains, both officiating.

Burial was in Terry 
County Memorial 
Cemetery in Brownfield.

Mrs. Mote died at 12; 10 
a.m. Monday in West 
Texas Hospital at Lubbock

after a long illness.
She moved to Levelland 

14 years ago from 
Brownfield where she was 
born. She was employed at 
East Side Cleaners and was 
a member of Morningside 
Baptist Church.

Survivors include three 
daughters, Mrs. Cindy 
Eason, Miss Pam Mote and 
Miss Donna Mote, all of 
Lubbock; a son, Alan of the 
home; her father, J.W. 
Strickland of Levelland; 
four sisters. Mrs. Fay 
Bartlett of Brownfield, 
Mrs. Oletha Sanders of 
Earth, Mrs. Marie Wilson 
of Levelland, and Mrs. Nita 
Colson of Blunt, South 
Dakota; four brothers, 
Alvie Strickland of Lub­
bock, Aaron Strickland of 
San Angelo, Durward 
Strickland of Dimmitt and 
James Strickland of 
Brownfield.

Pallbearers were James 
Donald Bartlett, Lee 
Bartlett, Jr., Marvin 
Sanders, Jr., Lonnie 
Strickland, Dickie Wilson, 
Jimmie Strickland and 
Terry Strickland.

Leon Pullen
LUBBOCK

(Special)—Services for 
Leon Bennett Pullen, 67, of 
3211 75th St. and a 27-year 
Lubbock resident were at 
2:30 p.m. Wednesday in 
Canyon Church on Acuff 
Road.

Officiating was the Rev. 
Abe Hester of La mesa and 
the Rev. Grady Adcock, 
pastor of Canyon Church.

Entombment was in

Resthaven Mausoleum 
under the direction of 
Reathaven-Singleton- 
W ilson i Funeral Home.

Pullen died early 
Tuesday at his home after a 
lengthy illness.'

Pullen moved to 
Lubbock from Dallas and 
founded the Central 
American Life Insurance 
Co. here He was company 
president until 1960 and 
chairman of the board until 
the company was sold in 
1964. Pullen was active in 
the oil business until his 
retirement in 1973. He was 
a Mason and a member of 
the Mackenzie Masonic 
Lodge. He also was a 
member of the Canyon 
Church, the Red Raider 
Club and was a lifetime 
member of the Sertoma 
Club

Survivors include his 
wife, Sadie; two sons, Don 
of Amarillo and Gary of 
Broken Arrow, Okla.; two 
daughters, Mrs. Shirley 
Lassiter of Dallas and Mrs. 
Sandra Bridges of Lub­
bock; a brother, Bob of 
Florida; two sisters, Mrs. 
Annie Mae Hemple of 
Mountainsburg, Ark., and 
Mrs Mary Jo Houchin of 
Earth; nine grandchildren; 
and two great-grand­
children.

Pallbearers were Bobby 
D. Miller, Billy Ray 
Martin, Donald Ray 
Mitchell, Norvis Henry, 
Tony Houchin and Jerry 
Houchin.

The family requests 
memorials be made in the 
form of contributions to the 
Canyon Church building 
fund at Rt. 1, Lubbock.

James Speer
SPR IN G LAK E  

(Special)—James Speer,

79, of Houston died Friday, 
April 1, of a heart 
attack in a Houston 
Hospital. Mr. Speer was a 
resident of Olton for some 
30 years.

Services were Monday 
in Memorial Oaks at 
Houston.

Born at Temple, he was 
a pharmasist more than 50 
years.

Mr.Speer and Miss 
Nina Couch were married 
September 21, 1932 at
Hollis, Okla. They moved 
from Paducah to Olton in 
1946. They operated the 
Olton Drug Store until 
1956. For the next 20 years 
Mr. Speer was a realtor in 
Olton.

He was a member of the 
First Christian Church and 
was a member of the 
Masonic Lodge for over 50 
years.

Survivors include his 
wife, two sons, James 
Speer, Jr., El Paso, Robert 
Tazewell Speer, Houston; 
two daughters, Sharon 
Rankin, Paletina. III., Dana 
McIntyre, Missouri City, 
three brothers, two sisters 
and seven grandchildren.

Party Line
Mrs. Blanche Ramseur 

of Brownfield, is visiting in 
the home of the Bob 
Belew’s this week She is 
the mother of Mrs. Belew

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Kelley picked up their 
daughter Norma and 
children of
Spade went to Mrs. 
Kelley's mother, Mrs.
Charlie Sanders of Rawls 
for Easter.

iTMISVF
MONUMENTS

Wlnnsboro Blue Granite 
White Georgia Marble 
and others, including 

Bronze for Memorial Park 
Specifications 

See or call Collect 
Percy Parson. Olton

Phone 2B6-2S21 
or Frank Elds. Muleshoe 

Phone 272-4674

New And
Used

Saddles

A T

T-BAR WESTERN 
STORE

BUSINESS
O PPO R TU N ITY

Earn $80.00 weekly at 
home stuffing envelopes. 
Information: Rush 50 cents 
and stamped self-addressed 
envelope: Financial 
Miracles, P.O. Box 15129, 
Fort Worth, Texas 76119 
4/14/4tp.

FOR SALE: Whole 
pork sausage 2 pound 
packages for $2.00. Call 
257-3861 or come by the 
Richard Bills residence. 
4/14/2tc.

All Kinds Of Welding 
And

Hard Facing Points

We Build Cotton Trailers

James W elding Shop
Across From Barton Gin

I i  Katf huni

FIRST STATE BANK

DIMMITT. TEXAS

H A R BLOCK
Your Nssrsst 

Office I •
224 W. 2nd St 

Muleshoe 
272-32S3

Well Casing
12"-16"-1«"

Low Prices-Load Lota
Sunland Supply

806-364-1096 Nights

QUICKSALL PRYOR CO INC

Automobile Parts 
Supplies ft Equip 
P O Box 567 
Earth. Texaa

OW ENS ELECTRIC
ME SPECIALIZE IN:

Compute salts and sarvica of aloctric 
motors ( m w  and used), magnitos, 
starters and ganarator repairs.
L O A N  M O T O R S  A V A I L A B L E  

10 9  E .  2nd. 364 3572 H E R E FO R D , TX.

Floating 
Toilwator 

P u m p

Conserve that 
water

g l
^  1 V

" G u a r a n t e e d  S a tis fa c to r y  S a r v ic a "  
Warren Owan......... H i n t *  Milton

Hearing Aids

We Have Moved From 416 
Mitchell To 403 E. 14th

Clovis Hearing Aid Center

Phone 763-6900 Clovis, N.M.

DEAD STOCK 

REMOVAL

7-DAYS A WEEK 
SERVICE

Please Call As Soon 

As Possible

MULESHOE
BI-PRODUCTS

PhoM 966-2420

Springlake—Olton
by Mr*. Toni Stansell

Mr. and Mrs. Keith 
Boone, Mark, Michelle and 
Melanie attended last rites 
for Ivan M. Stewart in Fort 
Worth Wednesday. His 
widow is aunt of Mrs. 
Boone

Mr. and Mrs. W.R. 
Boone had as callers 
Tuesday afternoon her 
sister, Mrs. Bill Struve of 
Hereford and Mrs. Kgdar 
Tittle and Mrs. Zols 
Langford of Dimmitt.

Mrs. Bill Watson was 
admitted Saturday to a 
Littlefield hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Veo 
Busby and their daughter 
and family, Mr. and Mrs 
Jarold Simmons, Veo 
Wayne and Cherry Dell, 
returned Sunday afternoon 
after staying several days 
at L.B.J. Lake.

Mrs. T.C. Kennedy, 
Karin and Connie went to 
Decatur Thursday and 
relumed Sunday. They 
were guests of Kennedy's 
brother-in-law and sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Moss 
and their son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs 
Calvin Buchannan. Connie 
visited Liz Ann Stockdale 
of Bridgeport, formerly of 
Olton.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Johnson. Allen Lee and 
Michael of Amarillo were 
guests at a barbeque 
luncheon Sunday at the 
home of Mrs. Johnson's 
mother and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Arnold Washington. 
Brent, Jeffery and Steven 
The boys hunted Easter 
eggs in the afternoon

Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Crawford of Midland were 
here last week-end with her 
parents, Mr and Mrs. E.L. 
Dawson and their son 
Clint.

Visiting Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest 
Goforth were their son and 
family, Mr and Mrs Max 
Goforth, Miles and Demita 
of Hereford.

Mr. and Mrs. A.

E M B A R R A S S IN G .  B U R N IN G

Itching?
ZFMO relieves itching fast be­
cause its special 'anti-itch medi­
cation soothes inflamed surface 
tissues Get relief with thefirst ap­
plication of soothing, medicated 
ZfcMO O m t- N p t T I A  
men! or Liquid l i v l l l l /

GARAG E SALE

Clothing (different sizes), 
lawn mower, and odds and 
ends 409 NF. 1st. (Across 
from funeral home) 
Thursday thru Sunday.

April 
Specials

New 1977 A-C Gleanu 
Combine 20 ft header, 
diesel engine, cab heater
and atr conditioner,
$25,000 00

New Allis Chalmers 
Model 77. Air Champ 
planters $500 00 per row 
while they last

1 Allis Chalmers Hulling 
Cultivator 8 row 
$3300 00

Earl Ladd 
&

Sons, Inc.
Phone 272-3308 

Muleshoe, Texas

Hollingsworth were in
Hereford Sunday with their 
son and hia wife, Mr. and 
Mrs. Alton Hollingsworth 
who had as other guests 
their daughter and family, 
Mrs. Judy Noyes, Jessica 
and Caressa Sue of
Hereford.

Spending the week-end 
in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Watson were 
their daughter and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Townsend, Greg, Trent and 
Lori of Calera, Okla.

Sunday Mr and Mrs 
I.eslie G. Watson hosted a 
reunion for members of the 
Watson family Attending 
were the host's sisters, 
Mrs. Buck McClure and 
Mrs. Florene Madden, both 
of Lubbook. Mrs McClure 
was accompanied by her 
son and family. Mr. and 
Mrs. Allen McClure and 
Michael, also of Lubbock 
Brothers and families 
present were Mr and Mrs 
Lowell Watson of 
Springlake. their son and 
his wife. Mr and Mrs. Ken 
Watson of Plains and 
another son and family. 
Mr and Mrs Bud Watson 
and Lee of Pampa Mr and 
Mrs Earl Watson of 
Plainview and their 
daughter and family, Mrs 
Billy Gene Field, Michael 
and Jeri of Springlake 
Billy Watson of 
Springlake. his daughter 
and family. Mr. and Mrs. 
Eddie Townsend, Greg. 
Trent and Lori of Calera. 
Okla., another daughter 
and family. Mr and Mrs 
John Dayton, Carey and 
Chelsie and a son and 
family. Mr. and Mrs 
Buster Watson. Hope and 
Mikka. all of Springlake 
The host's son and (amity, 
Mr. and Mrs Harlon 
Watson, Monty and Marty 
of Springlake and Mrs 
Harlon Watson's parents. 
Mr and Mrs M G KeUar 
of Earth.

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Britton spent Sunday with 
her parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Clarence Davis of Quanah 
Mr. and Mrs. Britton were 
accompanied by their 
daughter Mary

JOB W AN TED : Do 
Painting, carpenter work, 
little plumbing, roofing, 
and yard work Sam Hill. 
2 5 ^ 3 0 5 ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^

Arthritis Sufferers:

WAKE UP WITHOUT 
ALL THAT STIFFNESS!

No* formula for arthritis 
minor pain is so strong you 
can take it less often and still 
wjkc up in the morning with­
out all the pam s stiffness 
Yet so gentle sou can take 
this tablet on an empty stom­
ach It s called A 'th r iin  Pain 
Form ula  Get hours of re­
lief Ask for A 'lh r itu  Pain 
Form ula by the makers of 
A nut in ' analyeur tableti

For Sale

NEW AND  

USED

Aluminum Pipe

OF ALL SIZES

-  ALSO -  
SIDE ROW

Sprinklers

-  a n d  -
UNDERGROUND

Irrigation Systems

Stateline 
Irrigation 

Company, Inc.

LitUefwldM ulaahoe 

Levelland

Mr. and Mrs. David 
Britton, Melissa and Kris 
were in Lubbock with Mrs. 
Britton's parents and 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Sid A. 
Lowery, Jr. and Pam and 
grandparents. Mr. and 
Mrs Sid A. Lowery.

Sunday evening callers 
of Mrs. Tom Stansell were 
Mr and Mrs F W  
Bearden of Earth.

Miss Connie Brown has 
been here several days with 
her parents. Mr. and Mrs 
G.E. Brown. Jr., and their 
sons, Glenn and Mike. 
Connie is employed as 
stenographer with Texaco 
Refinery Co. in Amarillo.

Sunday
visitors of Mr. 
C.C. Gray were 
and family, Mr. 
Alvis Gray, 
Shayna and 
Hereford

afternoon 
and Mrs 
their son 
and Mrs

Bonnie, 
Paul of

Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Boone were Saturday 
afternoon guests of their 
grandson and his wife. Mr 
and Mrs. Danny Boone of 
Spade.

Dining in Littlefield 
Sunday were Mr and Mrs. 
J.T. Gibson, their daughter 
and family, Mr and Mrs 
Hollis Cain, Cathy. Connie 
and Suzanne, and Mr and 
Mrs. Jim Winder and 
Ranae.

Sunday dinner guests of 
Mrs. Ola Gambrel were her 
daughter and family, Mr 
and Mrs. Larry Murrell and 
Jerry, and friends. Mrs 
Hazle LaDuke and Sue 
Smith.

Mr, and Mrs. W.R. 
Boone spent Sunday with 
her brother in-law and 
sister. Mr and Mrs Bill 
Struve of Hereford Other 
guests in the Struve home 
were the host couples 
daughter. Mr. and Mrs 
Clifford Hargrove. Tye and 
Penni of Adnan, and their 
son and family. Mr and 
Mrs. Kerry Struve. Kamie 
and Kyla of Hartiley. also 
the hostess' nephew, 
Kenneth Boone.

Mrs. Tom Stansell and 
her daughter, Mrs. John 
Carson of Krisley, Kansas 
were in Dimmitt during the 
week-end with Mrs. 
Stansell's daughter and 
family. Mr. and Mrs 
Dwight Joiner. Cory and

Brandon

Mrs E W. Walden and
her son and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Walden and Cory 
of Hereford, returned 
Tuesday from Toms' Ri ver, 
N.J. where they stayed two 
days with Mrs. Walden's 
nephew and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Kdgin and 
children.

Friday evening Mrs. 
Harlon Watson attended 
the wedding of her cousin 
Miss Janie Kay Henderson 
to Joe Ward Parents of the 
brideare Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Henderson of Dimmitt. 
Vows were pledged in I » e  
Street Baptist Church of 
Dimmitt.

Mr. and Mrs F W . 
Bearden were recent guests 
of their son and 
daughter-in-law Mr. and 
Mrs. Phil Bearden of 
McKinney

Mrs Hollis Cain had as 
guests at a bridge party 
Thursday, Mrs Thurman 
Lewis of Earth, Mrs 
Lennon Young of Olton. 
Mrs. Jerry Goheen of 
Fieldton. Mrs. J.T. Gibson. 
Mrs. Orville Drake. Mrs. 
J.J. Coker and Mrs. K.B. 
Parish.

Sunday Mr and Mrs. 
Robert Conner. Terry and 
Chuck had as dinner guests 
her parents. Mr and Mrs 
R G  Parker their 
daughter. Mrs Kay Campa 
and their son and his 
family. Mr. and Mrs A W. 
Parker, all of Earth. Mrs. 
Conner's sisters and
families. Mr and Mrs Clay 
Mick. Darrell and Eddie, 
and Mr and Mrs Danny 
Sullivan. Brad and 
Jonathan, all of Canyon, a 
brother-in-law and sister 
Mr. and Mrs Ervin 
Caskey and a
nephew in-law and niece. 
Mr and Mrs. Michael 
Williams, residents of 
Springlake. Also the
hostess brother Curtis 
Parker of Hub Joining the 
group in an Easter egg 
hunt Sunday afternoon 
were Mrs. Charles Parish, 
Cindy and Kyle of Earth

Steven Washington 
attended the Ice Capades in 
Amarillo Saturday 
evening. He was house
guest of his Step sister and 
family, Mr. and Mrs.
Wayne Johnson. Allen I.ee 
and Michael who live in 
Amarillo

FOR SALE
Four-Bedroom Home,

Carpeted Throughout,

Paneled Wallis, 

Spacious Utility Room.

With Lots of Cahinets.

For Sale By Owner,

Call 257-3967

For Appointment.

XIT Drive-In
MULESHOE, TEXAS 

Saturday and Sunday. April 14-17

" " S M M V M .
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Thai New Year To 
Be Celebrated

Uaially a person must 
travel overseas to observe 
local customs, however, a 
touch of the Orient can be 
seen at Reese Air Force 
Base April 16. at the Base 
Chapel when local people of 
oriental descent celebrate 
Thiland's traditional old 
new year with a Water 
Festival

In Thailand the festival 
commemorates the 
beginning of a new year 
with three days of fun, 
floats, noisy bands and 
brilliantly costumed women 
performing folk dances. 
Participants also sprinkle 
water on Buddha images.

Fiddlers'
Frolics

Friday. April 22, and 
Saturday. April 23. are the 
dates of this years 7 th 
annual Texas State 
Championship Fiddlers 
Frolics to be held at the new 
ultra modern, super 
spacious K of C. Hall in 
Hallettsvtlle. Texas. Friday 
night, designated as 'Cajun 
Fun 7 :ght, ' will also host 
the grand opening of the 
Texas Fiddler Hall of Fame 
and the Senior Division 
Contest. Everyone*
favorite Cajun. Ed Junot. 
will kick off the “ Cajun Fun 
N ight' festivities at 7:00 
p m. followed immediately 
by Cash Box Magazines 
pick of 1975 for in- 
<rumentali* and album of 
the year, the top Cajun 
entertainer o f the U. S., 

Fiddlin Frenchie Burke" 
and his band. The 
Outlaws." Next will be one 
of the main highlights of 
this years Fiddlers Frolics, 
the opening of the first and 
only Fiddler Hall of Fame 
in the slate o f*  I exas with 
the induction ^>f the late 
Claude Henson. The Senior 
Division C on test I ages 65 
and over) will follow and a 
second big C ajun Show 
featuring the “ Fiddlin 
Frenchie Burke Show and 
Ed Junot will conclude the 
nights activities

Saturdays festivities 
will begin at 10:00 a m 
with the Freshman Division 
Contest (ages 0 to 15) 
followed by the Open 
Diviaon Contest (any age) 
The winner of Saturday's 
competition will go on to 
compete against last years 
state champion fiddler. 
Randy Elmore who is now 
lead fiddler for the famous 
Red Steegal to determine 
the 1977 Texas State 
Champion Fiddler Various 
interim entertainment with 
plenty of pickin and 
grinnin will be provided 
throughout the event 

, At 9 00 p m Nash 
ville s own “ Dickey Lee” 
and his band the 9,999.999 
Tears" will perform for the 
big show and dance

This vear s contest is 
open to any fiddler, break 
down, blue grass, swing, 
western, etc., from the state 
of Texas to determine the 
Texas State Champion 
Over $3.000 00 in cash 
prizes will be awarded 

Food and drinks and 
facilities for self-contained 
campers are available on 
the grounds. Camping 
facilities with hookups are 
available at the large 
shaded city park

All proceeds from the 
Fiddlers Frolics go to 
charity and to promote 
Texas fiddling

Children’s 
Clinic Set

The 21st annual 
Hereford Oasis Shrine Club 
children'sdinic will be held 
Saturday. April 30 at 
Hereford Medical and 
Surgical Clink

Phyacians in fields 
including orthopedics, 

ch and hearing.

monks, parents, and friends 
as a gesture of veneration.

Two monks from the 
W at Buddhawararam 
T emple in Denver, 
Colorado, will officiate the 
fetgival. Invitations have 
also been sent to oriental 
students from the local 
colleges.

The festival begins at 
10 am . Presentation of 
food to the monks la 
traditional celebrant) will 
be made at 11 a m followed 
by a blessing by the monks 
at 11:45. Lunch for 
everyone will follow at 
12:45 p.m. A variety of 
Thai dishes will be available 
at no charge, and for those 
who wish, American snacks 
will be available

Shows and folk dancing 
will continue throughout 
the afternoon until the 
festival closes at 5 p.m 
There will be a $2 per 
person for adults admission 
charge with children free for 
the festival The money 
raised will go to pay ex­
penses of the monks and for 
donations to the temple

For more information 
and ticket information, call 
area code 806-763-7711.

radiology cardiology,
pediatrics. opthamology. 
plastic surgery, 
otolarynsolog,’, surgery, 
and neuroloio will oe on 
hand for the clinic

The clinic is held each 
year to determine any 
medical deficiencies in 
children who might not 
ordinarily be able to pay for 
complete examinations.

The day will get un­
derway Saturday at 6:30 
pm  as Shnne Nobles and 
their Wives register at the 
C ivk Club Center

At 8 a m registration of 
children will he held at the 
Southwestern Public
Service Building at 4th and 
Lee Street*

All children must
pre-register with their own 
doctor prior to being
registered for Saturday s
clink

Registration forms are 

available from private 
physKians from any
Shnner. or from Dr. A.T. 
Mims of the Hereford 
Medical and Surgical 
Clinic Dr Mims is serving 
as director for the day-long 
project

Hereford * Noon lJons 
will cater a luncheon for 
clinic participant* at the
Hereford High School 
Cafeteria

Language 

('amp Set
Deadline For FilingTaxes

Clarence Lang.Camp
Director of the Spanish and 
German camps at Texas 
Lutheran College in 
Seguin. Texas announces 
that again this summer 
senior high and junior high 
students can partkipate in 
a week long Spanish or 
German language camp 
held in the last week in 
July. July 25-29 These 
camps are held on a college 
campus. 30 miles east of 
San Antonio, three hours 
dnve from Houston and 
Corpus Christi Em­
phasis is on learning the 
selected language in

everyday fun-learning 
situations, with the use of 
films, games, tapes and 
projects The campers will 
stay in air-conditioned 
dormitories

Previous experience in 
the language is not 
necessary, but certainly 
helpful Pre-registration is 
necessary, and should be 
doe early Fee for the camp 
is $64

For information write
t i m p s  T IC

SF.GUIN* TE X AS  78155.

Austin- State Comptroller 
Bob Bullock today urged 
Texas retail merchants and 
other sales tax permit 
holders to put a big red 
circle around April 30 on 
their calendars.

That's the deadline for 
filing quarterly sales tax 
reports with the State 
Comptroller's Office.

"Failure to meet that 
deadline can result in 
penalties for the sales tax 
permit holder and a lot of 
additional work for my 
office."Bullock said

MANY  FAMI L I ES  in 
Ruttiz art heartened to r« 
eaivt Ittttri from America

ATTRACTIVE COOKWARE 
can improve th« look of an 
antire kitchen

Som r com r w ith c h ic  
atripe* in warm lo n r i  o f  
brown and sold <*n a porcw 
lain e x te r io r  o f  apeckled 
cream Made by Weat Bend, 
they have coordinated brown 
lida and brown handle* that 
are *afe in preheated ovena 
up to 350°F

Just because thi* cookware 
la *m artly  a ty led  doean ’ t 
mean it ian'1 atyled to do 
a amart job on the range 
It feature* an in ter io r  o f 
"SilverStone" premium non 
atick aurface created  by 
Du Pont. In addition, it ‘a 
conatructed o f heavy gaugr 
aluminum, preferred for it* 
fa*t, even heating qualities

Thu cookware can add a 
touch o f excellence to your 
cooking. ea»etoyour cleaning 
and elegance to your kitchen.

F o r  s h a llo w  w a t e r  
p u m p in g  p ick up 
y o u r  " 3 0 3 "  and 
P U T  ER  T H E R E  

P A R T N E R !
KM P* powerful new 303”
move-around water pump can be 
float mounted or w l on .hallow 
bottom*

H
3 models electric I' HP 

akrtnc 7 HP 
gas powered 8 HP

SO to 400 it pm output

i depending on accessories l 
pruning continuously 
Unique conservation features 
- lo r  return water systems
— ditch baarment swimming 

pool pumpout
-  sump pump lor lake cabins

YOU CAN BANK ON

Free
Folder

IAKI PUMPS A 
PASHM WINDMILLS

to* **' as* »»r MU 
EARTH TEX a 

K  7»031 /

Write
Today

WE’RE MOVING!
^ H e r e f o r d  T r a v e l  Ce n t e r

IS MOVING FROM SUGANIAND MRU 
TO

144 W. SECOND
WE WILL BE IN THIS NEW LOCATION 

MONDAY APRIL 11

BEMEMBER....
THERE IS NO EXTRA CHARGE FOR 

OUR SERVICES 
WE CAN ARRANGE

•  AIRUN E TICKETS •  HOTEL RESERVATIONS 
• C A R  RENTALS •  CRUISES 

•  VACATION N A N S
ABOUT OUR DIRECT FI 

TO LAS VEGAS

Bullock urged sale* Ux 
permit holders to contact 
the nearest Comptroller's 
Field Office or call his 
toll-free tax information 
number. 1-800-262-5556 if 
they have any queetion 
about their returns.

TUNING;" r« 
TOPICS J
Advice On Radio Rrcaivtri 
For Quality And Economy

Kxperta at the EWtlwmc In 
duatricN Asaormtion auy the 
antenna cun be as important a* 
the tuner itself

• • •
Some sound advice if you're 

in the market for a radio re

ce iver i* not get *way#d 
by c h r o m e  r a th e r  than 
chromatics A receiver that 
look* like the control panel of a 
747 may he pretty to look at. hut 
one with s simple exterior and 
accurate music reproduction I* 
what you should look for

Some 172,000 businesses 
file their sales tax reports 
on a quarterly basis, 
Bullock said.

There'* an accessory to your 
receiver that's rapidly Scorn 
mg a necessity if you don't 
want to impose your listening 
taste on others With a head 
phone you can preserve your 
privacy and not intrude on any 
one else s

Your FM tuner or receiver, 
like your television, is a line of 
sight medium Therefore, the 
right antenpa. properly 
oriented, will make a Ire 
mendous difference in the 
quality of your reception

mmmmmmmm— ■ ■ ■ ■ ■ ■ ■  — ■ i

Friday Night Fish Fry

Fish & French Fries

$149

Cafeteria Style-Weekdays 
Buffet Style-Sunday

Sagebrush Inn L IT T LE F IE LD
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▼
♦
♦▲ It's  Here

▼
4
4
A♦

♦
♦▲ TURQUOISE

▼

4
A♦

♦
♦A COUNTRY

▼
4
4

♦
4 5 3 t  E. F irst 3 6 4  4 9 1 2

4
4

♦ A lice  H a r r i s  O w n e r  O perator 4
♦
4 1 i i f - t lu  v i l i i ' i i  '•in  iird n  v ’

4
4

♦
♦

<>:.i<) \  M -  0 :0 0  I'M  

1 I r r t ' f o n l

4
4

4 4
♦ O tte rin g  you  the tine st in: ▼a♦
4 •TURQUOISE JEWELRY 4
♦ •SILVER JEWELRY 4
♦
♦▲

•SILVER and COPPER INLAY ♦
4▲

TUESDAY
NIGHT

BUFFET
Every Tuesday  

n ight

ALL Y O U  C A N E A T  

of our great p izza  

(thick or thin) 

Spaghetti, c a v a t in i ,  

soup, plus our

gre a t sa lad  bar.

A L L  F O R  n 79 
5 :30  to 8:00 p.m.

NOON BUFFET 

Sun.-Friday 11 AM-1 P.M.

T u p s . Night 5:30-8 P.M.

’H ■> .rtV-m

C NTfc. Pun Hui Im

385-3905 Littlefield Pizza Hut 1808 Hall Avenue

s

ENDS SATURDAY. APRIL I t

1 5  °/0 O FF

PU RCHASE O V ER  *4.00 E X C L U D IN G  T O B A C C O , SUG AR 
A N D  BOTTLES

(Sorry, no Gunn Brother Stamp*)

Thank you to aN our friends and customers 
who have been loyd to vs daring all these years.

We have appreciated your

mm
LITTLEFIELD LITTLE F
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High Plains Happenings

April 18

SW ISHER CO.—4-H'ers 
^working on home en- 

• lyironment projects will 
%ave a meeting Monday. 
jApril 18. at 4:30 p.m. in 
^Tulia. Contact County 
Extension Agent Judy 

C a r lis le  for additional 
^form ation.

April 19

iC A K ZA  CO —The last of a 
-$enes of meetings on estate 

inning will be held 
jesday. April 19 at 7:30 

i.m. at the Yoakum 
bounty Party House, 
f oakum County Park 

{between Plains and 
•'J)enver City), according to 
Mary Williams, county 
Extension agent.

.G ARZA CO. — The last of a 
eyeries of meetings on estere 
planning will be held 
j e s d a y .  April 19 at 7:30 
$.m. at the Post Com­

m unity Center, Post, 
Recording to Paula 
^Cawthon and Syd Conner, 
bounty Extension agents.

ifrOAKUM  C M - T h e  
^public is invited to a 
seminar on healthy hearts 

.-Tuesday, April 17 at 7:30 
I p.m. at the Yoakum 
I County Party House.
• Yoakum County Park 

(between Plains and 
Denver City), according to 
Mary Williams, county 
Extension agent.

district 3—The District 3 
4-H livestock, horse and 
soil judging contests will be 
held Tuesday, April 19 in 
Roby, Texas. Contact Ed 
Garnett, district Extension 
agent for more information.

April 20

H E M P H ILL  C O .-A  
county-wide program on 
microwave cooking will be 
presented Wednesday. 
April 20 at 2:00 p.m. at the 
WTC.T.U. Building, 
Canadian. Ms. Billie 
Phillips of Ft. Worth will 
present the program, 
according to Donna 
Brauchi, county Extension 
agent.

Hockley County home 
demonstration leaders will 
be held Thursday, April 21 
at 2:00 p.m. at the Ex­
tension Office meeting 
room, Houston and Avenue 
L. The training will be on 
childrens clothing, ac­
cording to Linda Pittman, 
county Extension agent

LUBBOCK C O .-A  
program entitled “ living 
with change" will be held 
for interested persons 
Thursday. April 21 at St. 
John's United Methodist 
Church, Lubbock. The 
program deals with a study 
of the family, according to 
District Extension Agent 
Catherine Crawford.

IRS Urges Private Applicators Training 

Check SSN Program Set
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April 22

G RAY C O .-T h e  public is 
invited to an appliance 
parade featuring 
microwave cooking Friday, 
April 22 at 10:00 a m. at 
the Courthouse Annex 
meeting room. Ms. Billie 
Phillips, home economist 
from Ft. Worth, will be 
featured speaker, according 
to Elaine Houston, county 
Extension agent

April 23

BAYLO R C O .-T h e  public 
is invited to a bicycle rodeo 
Saturday, April 23 at the 
Baylor County Extension 
Building. Seymour, 
beginning at 9:00 am., 
according to Lowell Cure, 
county Extension agent.

(J. My neighbor. who ha* 
just turned ttt, nays he‘ » 
going to uae the proceed* o f 
hi* $100,000 Mtraight life 
policy to providr him with 
income. He b o u g h t  the 
policy at age 115. fa n  he do 
that?

• • •

A He certainly can A 
■truight life pulley bought at 
the age of 35 would have a 
guaranteed ra ih  value o f 
about $45,000 or more This 
will provide your neighbor a 
guaranteed life income of 
ap p rox im ate ly  $280.00 a 
month, a total o f $3,360 per 
year

Taxpayers should make 
sure that the correct social 
security numbers are listed 
on their 1977 tax returns. 
When an incorrect social 
security number appears, 
the processing of the return 
is slowed and any refund 
due could be delayed, the 
Internal Revenue Service 
said.

To help avoid this 
problem, taxpayers should 
use the peel-off label in­
cluded in the tax package 
received in the mail. This 
label contains the name, 
address and social security 
number of the taxpayer. If 
the social security number 
or other information listed 
is incorrect, the correct 
information should be 
written in right on the 
label.

If a taxpayer has had a 
change in name since last 
year, a local office of the 
Social Security Ad­
ministration should be 
contacted so that the 
taxpayer's name will 
correspond to his or her 
social security number.

The social security 
number of both husband 
and wife must be listed on 
joint returns, the IRS said, 
even for couples with only 
one income source or one 
spouse working

Lamb County 
producers will have an 
opportunity to complete a 
training program leading to 
certification as private 
applicators at one of the 
following programs, ac­
cording to John Farris. 
County Extension Agent.

April 25. 1977 at 6:45 
p.m. at the Lamb County 
Ag & Community Center, 
Littlefield, Texas.

April 28, 1977 t 6:45 
p.m. at the South Plains 
Community Center, Olton. 
Texas

April 29. 1977 at 6:46 
p.m. at the Earth Show 
Barns. Earth, Texas.

The Private Applicator 
Certification Training 
Program, one of the op­
tional means of qualifying 
for certification as a private 
applicator of restricted-use 
pesticides. includes a 
discussion of laws, labels 
and labeling, pesticide 
safety. mixing and 
calibration and pests and 
pest damage identification.

The program prepared 
by the Texas Agricultural 
Extenaon Service includes 
a review of certain questions 
relating to the information 
presented.

The program will 
require approximately 3

L o t s  O f

New & Used 
Furniture

At

Give-A*Way Prices

Come In And See

1/2 hours. Those attending 
and seeking certification as 
private applicators will have 
an opportunity to complete 
a Request for Private

Applicator Certification 
which will be forwarded to 
the Texas Department of 
Agriculture (T D A ) for 
issuance of certification.

The law which 
requires certification of 
private applicators is the 
Federal Insecticide, 
Fungicide, and Rodenticide 
Act (F IF R A ), which will 
be enforced by the En­
vironmental Protection 
Agency. Under this act, all 
uses of pesticides will be 
classified as either 
registered use ok general 
use. and all ap­
plicators-both private and 
commercial-will be cer­
tified as a requisite to legal 
use or supervision of the 
;ise of registered pesticides

The Federal In­
secticide. Fungicide, and 
Rodenticide Act (F IF R A i 
as amended, enforced by 
the Environmental 
Protection Agency, includes 
among other requirements 
11) the classification of all 
uses of pesticides as either 
restricted use or general use 
and (2 ) certification of 
applicators (private and 
commercial) as a requisite 
to the legal uae or super­
vision of use of restric 
ted-use pesticides.

The Texas Pesticide 
Control Act, although not 
requiring certification of 
private applicators, 
authorizes the Commission 
of Agriculture to establish a 
program to certify private 
applicators, on a voluntary 
basis, who wish to use or 
supervise the use of

122 S. First Muleshoe 272-3030
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April 21

DEAF SM ITH  C O .-A  
meeting on consumer 
choices projects will be held 
for interested 4-H’ers 
Thursday, April 21 at 4:00 
p.m. at the Deaf Smith 
County Community 
Center, Hereford, ac­
cording to Juston McBride, 
.county Extension agent.

•BAYLOR C O .-T h e  
;Rolling Plains Soils Lab. 
•Baylor County Extension 
Complex, Seymour, will 
Jiold an open house for 
•county Extension agents 
and news media personnel 
^Thursday. April 21. For 
^nore information contact 
.Ed Garnett, district Ex­
tension agent.

C O .-A  
for

(/a/idesi y/i&ene/u/

6 If) S. First St.

Bedding Plants Rose Bushes 

Shrubs Trees

Landscaping Available
TAe carry Fertilnnie and Ortho Products

^ ___ (

^  for complete lawn and garden rare.

Decorators 216 
Nursery & Floral

t

MULESHOE 272-4340

t
W e have som ething cooking

F A C T O R Y  i ,  :

REBATES
i ’^ ■ M l

on these ,- JH  
models ^

I «NICROWAVE
COOKING CENTER 
modrl RM966CV

R - q - c -

FROM 
APRIL 1 
THRU
MAY 31 19/7

*iCRi!*Mt OVEN modn *114301
St 11 CIMNINC (IVIN 
RANGE modrl RUM?*

restricted-use pesticides in 
compliance with federal 
law

The term "private 
applicator" means a cer­
tified applicator who uses or 

supervises the use of any 
pesticide which is classified 
for restricted use for 
purposes of producing any 
agricultural commodity on 
property owned or rented 
by him or his employer or, if 
applied without com­
pensation other than 
trading of personal services 
Eietween producers of 
agricultural commodities, 
on the property of another 
person.

The angle-product, 
angle-purchase, angle-use 
certification for emergency 
atuations will be available 
as restricted-use pesticides

Swing Into Spring

White Sale 20% Off 
Wranglers

Buy 3 Get 1 Free

Sizes 27-42

50% Off Western Suits
Off On Many Item920-60%

Manager

“ Doc” Holiday

Holiday Family Stores
(next to Security State Bank) 

r,01 Ave 5 Harwell Phone 481-9071

Qood Selection a*  

‘Banquet ‘Dresses
9

f
A T  *■treeman’8

Alterations #  !•'•* ‘ v\i

AND

WEDDING PHOTOGRAPHY 

COMPLETE WEDDING ATTIRE & ACCESSORIES

113 OJU 4tl 762-0474
CLO VIS

PlTTSRURGH PAINTS

S P W /V G P A /W -U P  r

Williams T V  <X Appliance
in M AIN MULESHOE 272-56311
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Wheelbarrow-Full

Fishing Tackle

’/2 Price

G78-14

G78-15
H78-15

j i M .
JLSiiL
2.79

33.97

35.49

37.00

T I R E
2 + 2 + 1 Steel Belted Radiele 

White Walls
•  2 POLYESTER CORO PLIES
•  2 FIBERGLASS BELTS
•  1 STEEL BELT
44,000 MILE UMfTED WARRANTY

BR70-13
FR70-14

OR TO-14
HR70-14

GR70-15

HR70-15

JR70-15

LR7015

12.26

m
3.00

3.29

3 .05

3.27

3.43

J M .

140.98

46.59

49.43

51.19
51.54

53.09

66.93

J U M .
P lu «Ft Ta.

Prices Good 
Thursday

Friday
&

Saturday

Stereo
$16800

2 Tapes — Your Choice 

Willi Stereo Purchase

Hanging Ashtrays 8  Planters
'h Price

Bicycle Baby Carrier

Upright Vacuum Cleaner
$j|poo

2800 CFM
Air Cooler

TOM LIVELY’S

W H IT E S
r r A U T ©

Unfinished Hutch

‘49“
One Only

A S  A d v e r t is e d
o n  T V

5

257-2193

Lawn Ft Leaf Rakes
89

T A P E S  £ 4 s r

«■ /  -# •#  t  +  i


