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MRS. KUNTN BARRED FROM EVER SEEING BABY Mrs. Shlrleen Kunln, convicted slater of her
two-year-- daughter, sits with her attorney, Richard Maddox, in a Los Angeles, Calif., court, where

sfee andher husbandwere forever barredfrom seeing again their one-mon- th old son, born while she
wasawaiting triaL At right Deputy Probation Officer Lila Yingling carries the baby from the court.

(AP WIrephoto).

Marvin Miller

Named School

Board Head
Marvin M. Miller, who was top

candidatein a field of threein last
Saturday's--.election, was named
chairmanof the Big Spring school
board Thursday nighL

He succeeds Ira L. "Thurman,
Teteranof 12 years of board serv-
ice, as presiding officer. Thurman
did not seek in the Sat-

urday balloting.
The board also elected Dewey

Martin as vice-preside- nt and re-

jected John Coffee as secretary
at the Thursday night session.

The "secretarywas instructed to
prepare a formal letter of appre-

ciation to Thurman, 'commending
fcim for his service on the board
during the past 12 years.

Results of the Saturday election
were canvassed and approved,
ghowing 799 votes for Miller, 758

for H. W. Smith, 520 for Ted 0.
Groebl and one each for C E.
Talbot, Alvin Shroyer and H. T--
JJohannon.Smith was seated with
the board for the first time, and
Miller was sworn in for his first
elective term. Miller had been
aervjsg byappointment to fill the
unexpired term of R. L. Tollett,
who resigned severalmonths ago.

la connection with the regular"
business agenda considerable dis-

cussiondevelopedtMncerning adop
tion of new contract forms for
teachers. Another meeting was
scheduled for April 14 at 5 p. m.
to elect teachersfor the next school
rear, and Dewey Martin and Dan
Conley were named to assistW.

superintendent, in
preparing a contract form to be
presentedat that session for ap
proval.

Upon Miller's suggestion, the
boaM adoptei preliminary plans
for Issuing a handbookwhich would
utline policies of the board and

administration and other pertinent
informational data. Plans are to
sake the booklets available to
teachersand to parentsand tax-

payers.
A contract leasing the baseball

park to Pat Stasey and Claude
McAden. owners of the local pro-
fessional baseball team, for the
summerwas approved. A tentative
agreementon that matterhadbeen
reached at an earlier session.The
board also agreedto lend the base-
ball club .approximately 200 steel
chairs to be used in box seats,
lubject to replacementof any dam-
ages which might occur. Plans
were made for ourchasinc addi
tional flood lights for athletic fields !

to eliminate the necessityof switch
ing equipment between the base
ball park and the football field.

The board voted to make im
mediate payment in. full on a S4,--
800 note which represents the
school's debt on the baseball park,
and$6,600 on a bus usedfor trans-
portation of athletic teamsand oth-
er schoolorganizations. Both items
were set up to be amortized over
definite periods, but with funds
available now the trusteeselected,
to make immediate payment to
curtail interest charges.

A refund of S1.2S3 in taxes paid
to the school district by the Mag-
nolia Pipeline Co. through error
was authorized, and Texas Elec-
tric Service Co. was granted use of
the High school gymnasium for .an
electric show, subject to regula-
tions yet to be drawn.

The textbook committee's recom-
mendation concerning materialsto
be used in course of instruction
during the next school year was
approved, and a request by the
YMCA for use of the High school
gymnasium for an adult recrea-
tion program received favorable
action.

CorpusMan Will
HeadWater Meet

AUSTIN. April 9. tfi-- E. B. Neis--
wanger of Corpus Christi today'
aad beenassigned the job of

Gov. Beauford.H. Jes-
ter's Southwest Texas Water Con-lervati- on

Conference.
Neiswanger's appointment was

announcedyesterdayby the gov-

ernor. He Is director of the Texas
Water Conservation Association.

The conference will include 48
Jouthwcs Texas counties.
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NAMED CAA HEAD. Delos
Wilson Rentzel (above) of Hous-

ton, Tex., was nominated by
PresidentTruman as head ofthe
Civil Aeronautics Administra-
tion April 8. The Texas native
succeeds Theodore P. Wright,
who resigned. (AP WIrephoto).

House Painter

Admits Killing -

New York Bride
CTW YORK. April 9, OR An

unemployed house painter, police
said, admitted early today he had
slain Mrs. Vera Lotito,
bride, when she surprised him
while he was burglarizing her mid-tow- n

apartment
The man, Julio Ramirez Perez,

Puerto Rican, booked
on a homicide charge, had been
held since last Friday, three days
after the slaying, as a material
witness in the case. He was ar-

rested when he entered a pawn-

shopcarrying a raccooncoat stolen
from the slain woman's apartment.

Mrs. Lotito, a bride of four
mdnths, was stabbed 15 times and
garrotedwith a necktie. Her body
was found by hor husband.

Police Captain Frank Dunn said
Perez "signed a confession" early
today admitting he plunged a
screwdriver repeatedly into the
body of Mrs. Lotito when she
walked in on him while he was
ransacking the Lotito apartment.

Until today Perez steadfastly
protestedhis innocenceof the slay-
ing. He insisted under steady
questioning that the coat and other
articles belonging to the murdered
woman had been bought by him
from a man he knew only as
Danny.

STASSEN FAVOREb

OMAHA, April 9. V-T- he pos-
sibility developed today that Sen-
ator Arthur Vandenberg w h o
says he isn't running may in-

fluence the result of Nebraska's
GOP presidential primary.

Vandenberg is one of seven
whose names have been entered
in next Tuesday's voting. Nebras-
ka Republicans will say then what
man they would like the party to
nominate for president at the June
Philadelphia convention.

The Michigan senator isn't cam-
paigning. In fact, he tried to get
his name withdrawn. This was bi
line with his repeated statements
that he isn't a candidate and will
not "connive" in a draft move-
ment

But Nebraska politicians who
know their way around say there
is some strong sentiment in the
state for the chairman of the
Senate Foreign Relations Commit-
tee.

These politicians do not suggest
that Vandenberg,without any cam-
paign or any organization and
without being a candidate, can top
the list of possible list of nom-
inees in the balloting here.

But they do contend that he is

Jewish Army

RetakesKastei

From The Arabs
By The Atioeiattd Prttl

Haganah fighters recaptured
Kastei today In the seven-da-y see-
saw battle for the strategic Arab
village commanding a Jewish life-

line to food-sho- rt Jerusalem, a
Jewish Agency spokesman an-

nounced.
Haganah, the Jewish militia,

had held the village' through six
days of fierce Arab attacks until
yesterday, when a strong Arab
force stormed it The Arab coni-mand- er,

Abdul Khadder Husscini,
cousin of the exiled Mufti of Je-
rusalem, was reported by Arab
officials to have been killed in the
assault Latest reports said five
other Arabs and nine Jews were
killed in yesterday's fighting.

Preliminary Arab-Jewi- sh truce
talks failed yesterday at Lake
Success, N. Y. A special session
of the United Nations assembly
has been called for next Friday
to reconsider the Palestln prob-
lem, Including the United States
proposal of a UN trusteeship and
the.previously--votedpartitioaplan.

JesterTo Give

Demo Party Views
AUSTIN. April 9. OB Gov. Beau-for- d

H. Jester has promised to
make clear his views on what it
would mean if Texas sends an
uninstructed delegation to the na-

tional Democratic convention.
Jester and officials of the State

Executive Committee, the Young
Democrats of Texas and the As
sociation of County Democratic
Chairmen have been urging an
uninstructed delegation.

"I'll make my position clear
when they hold the big barbecue
at Fort Worth," Jester said at
yesterday'spress conference. He
said the executive committee
should alsoclarify.

The barbecue costing $5 per
plate will be held April 20. Tru-
man Democrats will compete by
offering a free barbecueat Waco
the same day.

Rachmaninoff Music
Discovery Is Told

MOSCOW, April 9. W) Two un-

published piano compositions by
the late Russian composer, Sergei
Rachmaninoff, have been discov-
ered, it was announced today.

The compositions arc for six
hands, and will be published soon.

likely to be among the top four.
The three leaders generally are
expected to be Harold E. Stassen,
who walked away with the Wis-

consin primary, Gov. Thomas E.
Dewey of New York and Senator
Robert A. Taft

The politicians here haven't fig-
ured out yet which of the three
would be hit hardest by an un-

expectedly iarne Vandenberg vote.
) Stassen. who has been unstint
ing in his praise of Vandenberg's
record, hinted at a news con-
ference here yesterday he thinks
the vote cast for some of those
who aren't campaigning in Ne-

braska may cloud the primary
outcome.

Besides Vandenberg, the names
of Gen. Douglas MacArthur, Gov.
Earl Warren and House Speaker
Joseph Martin will appearon the
Tuesday ballot. None of the latter
has made a campaign, although
Warren made one speech in the
state.

MacArthur. who gathered in
eight delegates to Stasscn's 19 In
Wisconsin, is not looked upon as
much of a factor in the contest
here.

Vandenberg Factor
In Nebraska Race

BIG SPRING, TEXAS,

Four-Pow-er

German Meet

Is Cancelled
Move Reveals
A New Low
In Relations

BERLIN, April 9. (AP)
Gen. Lucius D. Clay an-

nounced today there will be
no meeting of the Allied Con-

trol Council for Germany to-

morrow, the regular meeting
day.

Clay, United States military
governor and council chairman for
April, explained that none of the
four occupying powers had asked
for a session.

This development emphasized
the-ne-w low to which four-pow-er

cooperation has fallen since the
Russians opened up their recent
campaign to crowd the western
Allies out of Berlin.

The Control Council is Ger
many's top ruling body, made up
of the U. S., British, French and
Russian military governors. It has
not met since the Russianswalked
out on the March 20 session.

Soviet Marshal Vassily D. Soko-lovsk-y,

March chairman, failed to
call a meeting for March 30, the
regular day. Clay makes the de
cisions on April meetings. His an-

nouncement said:
"Since there have been no re-

quests for a meeting from any of
the delegationsandno subject has
been presented for discussion,
there will be no meeting of the
Allied Control Council April 10."

The chairmanship rotatesamong
the four powers each month.

Soviet authorities were reported
today to have approved finally the
setting up of a Communist-controlle- d

economic commission for
their occupation zone embracing
Eastern Germany.

Top U. S., British and French
leaders conferred yesterday on-- the
idea of a merger qf the French
zone with the economically com-
bined American and British zones
in the west

High American officials denied
today reports that final agreement
on a merger had been reached.

Submarine Base

Has SecondFire
GROTON. Conn., April 9. lfl

The second early morning fire in
less than two months struck the
Navy's submarine base here to-

day. It damaged a three-stor-y,

brick building into which base
headquarters had moved after a
fire on Feb. 11 destroyed the for-

mer headquarters structure.
The fire broke out about mid-

night CST and was reported to
have been brought un'der control
two hours later after damaging
the upper part of one end of the
building and burning a hole in the
roof.

Though two different sources at
the scene called the fire "pretty
bad" while it still was out of con-

trol, it was reported later that it
did not approach the seriousness
of the Feb. 11 blaze and apparent-
ly did not touch the section of the
building occupied by the head-
quartersoffices.

SenatorCan't
Afford To Run

TEMPLE, April 9. W)-- State Sen-

ator Buster Brown won't run for
reelection because' hecan't afford
it.

Brown said last night he couldn't
afford to serve a second term
from the 21st district from the
standpoint qf money or time.

"A statesenator should have an
Income above the $1,200 or more
paid him each two years by the
state," he said.

"A state senator'ssalary is ob-

viously Inadequate to meet actual
expenseswhile attending the legis-

lature.
"It affords 'no payment for loss

of income and nothing to cover
his expensesduring the remainder
of the two years," he said.

College Is Raided
By ChinesePolice

PEIPING, April 9. dents

of National Normal College re-

ported today that Peiping detec-
tives raided the institution, wound-

ed two of their classmates in a
burst of gunfire, and arrestednine
others.

The students said those arrested
were student body officers elect-
ed in defiance of a government
order that all such groups should
be appointed by school authorities.

Hoffman Approves
Voluntary Controls

WASHINGTON, April 9. W

Foreign Aid Chief Paul G. Hoff-

man predicted today that volun-
tary controls will do a "better
job" than federal regulation of
American industry in meeting the
recovery needs of Europe.
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Coal
Rail

HERALD

Strike Forces
Service Cut

No End Seen

Yet For Walkout
WASHINGTON, April 9. (AP) The 26-da-y old mine

shutdown forced the government today to order coal burn-
ing rail servicecut to half of normal.

The reduction is effective at midnight, April 15, and pre-
sumablywould be cancelledif mining resumesbefore them.

There appearedno immediate prospect, however, of an
end of the walkout despite a new threatof action against
John L. Lewis and hisUmtedf
Mine Workers.

Rep. Hartley (R-N-J) said that
if the Taft-Hartl- ey labor law vhich

he helped write fails "to put the
brakes" on Lewis, he will ask for
stiffer laws. Hartley is head of

the House Labor Committee.
The pending new cutback in

coal-burni- freight and passenger
train service was ordered by the
Office of Defense Transportation
and the InterstateCommerceCom
mission to save dwindling supplies
of coal.

ODT said Wednesday the rail-

roads had stocks enough to last
only 22 days.

The 25 per cent cut ordered to-

day is in addition to a similar
reduction put into effect earlier
by ICC and ODT. Those curtail-
ments have made approximately
70,000 railroaders idle.
Coal-- burning locomotives nor-

mally handle about 45 per cent of
the passenger trains and 65 per
cent of the freight service.

564,000 IDLE
The strike has crippled opera-

tions in other industries, especially
steel. In all, approximately 164,000

worker in various fields are idle
in addition to the 400,000 soft coal
miners.

Lewis is scheduled to appear
Monday to "show cause" why he
should not face a contempt of
court trial for ignoring a back-to-wor- k

order. The ld strike
resulted from a dispute over min-

ers' pensions.
The United Mine Workers' chief

wat cited for contempfc-k-W ednep
day by Justice T. Alan Golds'
borough, the samejudge who fined
Lewis and his union $3,510,000 for
ignoring a similar strike-restraini-

order in December, 1946.'The
Supreme Court later cut the
union's penalty to $700,000 but left
Lewis' personal fine at $10,000.

While court action and possible
new congressional moves hung
fire, new trouble built up for
Lewis and the UMW under the
Taft-Hartle- y act

The SouthernCoal Producers As-

sociation formally accused Lewis
and the unionof breaking the law
by refusing to recognize the as
sociation 'for bargaining purposes.1

A complaint making that charge
was filed with the National Labor
Relations Board, which assigned
it to the Baltimore regional office
for investigation.

That office can recommend ac
tion on an unfair labor practice
charge, a step which could lead
to still another court order.

The action of the southern pro
ducers stemmed from two long
and unproductive negotiating ses-

sions Wednesday and Thursday,
at which UMW representatives re-

fused to recognize the association.

College Fires

Wallace Backer
EVANSVILLE, Ind., April 9. Ml

Dr. George Parker, assistant
professor of religion and philoso-

phy at Evansville College and
president of the Vanderburgh
County Citizens for Wallace Com-
mittee, had a request from the
college today to resign from the
faculty immediately.

Parker presided Tuesday night
at a rally here addressedby Hen-
ry A. Wallace, third party presi
dential candidate.

Lincoln B. Hale, president of the
privately-endowe-d school support-
ed by the Methodist Church, an-

nounced that the executive com-

mittee of the board of trustees
had asked for Parker's resigna-
tion. Hale did not mention Park-
er's connection with the Wallace
organization.

"It is the opinion of the college
that owing to Mr. Parker's polit-

ical activities both on and off the
campus his usefulness to Evans-
ville College is at end," Dr. Hale
said in a statement.

"The college fully subscribes to
the principle of academic freedom
but believes that the Individual
who exercises the privilege must
assume the responsibility for his
utterances and actions when they
destroy confidenceand faith in the
institution of which he is a mem
ber."

ATTEND MEETING
County Supt. Walker Bailey and

Homer Barnes, superintendent of
schools at Knott, spent Thursday
In Lubbock where they attendedthe
regular board meeting of the West
Texas Teachers association.

PlansLaid

For Cancer

Fund Drive
Plans for a quick campaign to

raise a $2,000 quota for Howard
county in the American Cancer So
ciety campaign were developedat
a meeting Thursdayeveningat the
Settles.

Ted O. Groebl, who is general
chairman for the county, an-

nouncedselection of team captains
and that the solicitationwould start
on Wednesday.

He expressedhope that no more
than one week would be required
to reach thegoal.

Sixty per cent of the funds raised
here, he said, will remain in Texas
for educational and clinical pur
poses. Of the remaining 40 per
cent which goes to national, 25 per
cent is used in researchand 15 per
cent for administration -- and edu-
cation.

Education is stressed at both
levels, he said, because controlof
cancer depends upon early recog-
nition of it

Dr. R. B. G. Cowper, In a review
of cancer diagnosisand treatment,
affirmed the necessity of early de-

tection of thp Hiupasp
-poSiers"dIspTaye'd by Groebl pro

claimed that "every three minutes"
some one in the U. S. dies of
cancer. The malady strikes one of
eight persons; therefore it affects
one of two families.

Team captains named were Bill
Cox, A. D. Webb, J. H. Greene,
Boone Home, Carl Smith. Lloyd
Hawkins was named chairman of
radio information and Joe Fickle
of newspaper publicity. Mayor G.
W. Dabneyagreedto enlist workers
for the railroad canvass. Others
attending the meeting were Dr.
Cowper, J. H. Greene, and Ira
Thurman, treasurer.

GOP To Press
Anfi-Lync-

h Bill

WASHINGTON. April 9. Ufi

Republican senators voted today
to give a federal anti-lync-h bill
top priority in the Senate among
civil rights measures.

It probably will be offered on
the Senate floor in the next few
weeks.

Senator Taft (R-Ohi-o) said anti-lyn- ch

was placed ahead of' anti-po- ll

tax and
measure'; because the GOP sena-
tors believe it will be the easiest
to pass.

He said he believes personally
there Is a good chance the Senate
will limit debate this time in order
to obtain a vote. This would pre-
vent a filibuster by southern

MILLION MURDERS

NUERNBERG, Germany, April

9. wv-Tw- enty officers of Hitler's
SS (elite guard) were convicted
of wholesale murder today in an
American finding so biting the
death penalty for many seemed
inescapable. Sentenceswill be an-

nounced tomorrow morning.
A three-judg- e court found them

guilty on all three counts of an
indictment charging the killing of
at least a million Jews, gypsies
and others classified by the Nalzs
as racial undesirables. Only two
of the 22 men in the dock were
found innocent in any degree.

The judgment was handed down
by Presiding Judge Michael A.
Musmanno of Pittsburgh. He sum-

med up the counts as"plain mur-

der." The conviction was the most
in the1 history of the

Nuernberg war crimes trials.
One SS captain was acquitted

of two counts war crimes arid
crimes against humanity. He was
convicted of the third member

Today's
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CLARK, AIDE CONFER ON LEGAL MOVES Atteraey Gen-

eral Tom Clark (right) and his executive assistant, S. Grahaai
Morison, confer over legal papers in Clark's Justicedepartment
study In Washington. Earlier, Clark representeifry Metises,
obtained a contempt citation againstJohn L. Lewis and the United
Mine Workers. Lewis has beenordered to appear before a federal
judge next Monday to tell why he should not be punished far
ignoring a court order to end thecurrentsoft coal strike. (AP

DRAFT BILL DRAWN

U.S. Gearing Up

Growing Defenses
WASHINGTON, April 9. (Si Congressand the White Houet

gearedup machinery today to pump men, money and material into the
broadening defenseprogram.

Although major attention was centered on boosting the nation1!
air power other moves followed the'lines laid down by Secretary ol
Defense Forrestal. He cautioned Congressnot to build up one mill
tary arm at the expenseof any other.

"National security demands balanced forces," the secretary 4e
dared, adding "dollars alone do

not guarantee the delivery" of
military goods.

These were highlight develop-

ments along the lengthening pre-

parednessfront:
1. The House Armed Services

Committee drew up a draft bill
requiring registration of aU men
18 through 30, but making only
those 19 through 25 liable for
two years' service.

Forrestal who will testify at
ooeninehearings Monday proposed
much, the same legislation, but'
his called for registration of men
up to 45. He was due to discuss
the draft before the SenateArmed
Services Committee today.

2. The House Appropriations
Committee raced into hearings on
a bill. to pour $725 million into a
warplane expulsion drive. Forres-
tal put the "highest priority" la-

bel on. thee funds for the Air
Force and fleet aviation. Chairman
Taber (R-N- is sp.eding action
to have the bill ready for House
consideration Tuesday.

3. The White House told the
War Assets Administration to hold
up final disposition of unsold in-

dustrial plants, machine tools and
other equipment needed for war
production. The stop-ord- er was is-

sued to permit the munitions board
to survey the items in the next 30

days. The board already has put
150 major plants under the na-

tional security clause requiring
them to be so kept as to be

to war use In 120 days.

MOTHER ILL
Deputy Sheriff C. E. Klser has

been'called to Merkel. where his
Imother Is reported seriously ill.

ship in a criminal organization;
namely, the SS and the SD (a
department that ran a spy sys-

tem).
One corporal was found Innocent

of all three charges because' he
once quit the SS and got back into
it only through the draft

Convicted of all three counts
were four SS generals,12 colonels,
three majors and one lieutenant

They were commanding officers
of the Einsatz Commandos These
were units, none of more, than 2,-0-

men, established by Rcinhard
Heydnch. chief of the security
service. They were sent Into Rus-
sia behind the rampaging German
armies to wipe out whole classes
of peopleHitler and GestapoChief
Heinrich Himmler thought were
better off dead.

Mainly they exterminated Jews.
Their own records introduced in
court showed at least a million
slain. The prosecution held that
maybe two million died from their
bullets or in their gas vans.

FOR

Twenty SS Men Are
Convicted By Allies

News TODAY

TenPagsfTodiy",

West Europe"

SeemsAssured

Military Aid
WASHINGTON, April t, W--!fc

projected Western European ealem
now seems sure of stong .Ameri-
can military support as t way is
strengthenthe Westagainst feared
Russianexpansion.

In the opinion of Washingtoaef
Cclals, however, several major
problems remainto be worked owt,
including the precise forms IfcJ

support may take.
Belgian Premier Paul Henri

Spaak,who has conferred herethis
week with PresidentTruman, Us
dersecretaryof State Lovett, and
other leaders, told a news coa-feren- ce

the European nations win
ask for military as well as recov-
ery help later on.

First, Spaaksaid, they want to
consolidate their new organization

r which so far has gone through
only the first stages.

Spaakwas oneof the prime mov-
ers in a five-nati- meeting at
Brussels a month ago which drafU,
ed a treaty for economic,political '
and military Cooperation among
the westeriHstates.

The five nations which did the
drafting were Britain, France,Bel-
gium, The Netherlands, and Lux-
embourg.

Spaak reminded reporters last
night that Mr. Truman told Con-
gress on March 17 that.this coun-
try intends to back up'the free na-

tions of Europe in their struggle to
maintain their freedom against
Communist Russia.

WoodsAppearsV
As Rent Curb Head

WASHINGTON, April 9. UU
Housing Expediter T i g h e E.
Woods, bearing a new vote of con-
fidence from President Truman,
appears assured today of another
from the Senate,eventually.

Woods, who administers the fed-
eral rent control law, still has not
been confirmed forthe position to
which he was named last fall. The
former deputy administratorwas
moved up when Frank R. Cree-do-n

resigned
Chairman Tobey (R-N- said '

the SenateBanking Committeehas
beenholding up action on the nom-
ination pending a recommendation
from Senator Cain hJ Cain
headed thesubcommittee which
wrote the new rent control law
which went into effect April 1.

Before that the nomination bad
been shelved, presumably so Con-

gress might be assured that
Woods saw eye-to-e- ye with it on.
how the new law should be

S
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Plants, laid on "ties" two cables. Crude,
indeed but nevertheless suspensionbridge!

Full of symbolism, too! plants tHe hazardouspath
acrosssomeobstacle life's course. Those faith, sup-

porting footsteps there foundationbeneath.

There somethingelse: cablesare laslied trees.
must beanchored something or Someone.

When you build cablebridgeyou lash reed
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builds bridge of life anchors faith in GOD.

The Cliurch hasspecialized this kind of
centuries. Let's start building together SUNDAY.
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College Heights P--T A

Jas Musical Program,
alk By Dr. Hogan

!a musical program by members

If the first grade was given prec

eding the talk on "A Balanced
Flife" by Dr J. E. Hogan Thurs
day afternoon at the College
Heights Parent-Teach-er Associa-
tion.

Mrs. Maurice Roger's room did
a rhythmetic act which was called
freeexpression.Mrs. Norman Spen-

cer's group were dressed in west--'

ern costumes and gave a rhythm i

band selection.
Miss Betty Farrar accompanied

JuneJohnston, Tommie Thompson
and Kathleen Thomas who did a
ballet. They also sang and did a
tap to "little Bed Fox."

INSURANCE
H. B. Reagan Agency

mi MAIN PHONE 515

mm T
"

WELCOME yfO

FIRST ASSEMBLY

OF GOD

S. S. 9:45; Worship 11:00
aum. and 7:15p.m.

W. 4th and Lancaster

Spencer,
B. T.

Patterson. D.

O

H H
V.

i

I

Main StreetChurchof God
Tenth and

E.

"CHRISTIAN BROTHERHOOD"
Program 8:30 A. M.

Sunday 9:45 A. M.
Worship, by 10:50 A. M.
Y. P. Meeting, Chairman 6:45 P. M.

General 7 45 M.
& 7 30 P. M.

WELCOME

OF

A bridge and 42 afternoon will

be sponsored by the group some
time this month.

Mrs. Koger's room won the room

Mrs. W. N. Norrcd. president,
was as delegate to the

conference in Midland April
23 and 24.

presentwere Collins,
Mrs. W. D. Rowland. Mrs. E. L.
Springer, Mrs. Pearson, Mrs.
L. D. Jenkins. Mrs. F. S.

"W. Mrs. Clayton
McCarty, Mrs. Clayton Mrs
T. N. Culwell. Mrs. Hazel Griffith.

H. A. Mrs. T. P.
Mrs. V. D. Lovelace and Mrs.
Stanley Cameron.

Mrs. JessBailey, Mrs. Ben Whit- -

,aker, Mrs. Norman Mrs.
Bolding. Mrs. George White,

Mrs. Avis Mrs. P.

Main Streets
John Kolar,

Sermon

Service
Prayer

elected dis-

trict

Jack
Penlcn.

Mrs. Croan,

Mrs. Allen,

Carter, H. P. Wooten, Mrs
J. "V7. Arnett. Mrs. M. C. Brown,
Mrs. J. M. Saunders. Mrs. D. H.
Settles,Mrs. Grady McCrary, Mrs.
H. C. McPherson, Mrs Ben

Mrs. V. E. Friedewald.
Haley Haynes and Mrs. J.

C. Rogers.
Mrs. W. N. Norred, Mrs. Don

Seale, Mrs. Lucian Jones, Mrs.
Johnny Freeman,Mrs. B. F. Cof-

fey, Mrs. H. L. Thompson,
H. A. Moore. Mrs. L. M. Cunning-
ham. Mrs. B. Mittel. Mrs. H. H.
Stephens, Mrs. Ted Phillips. Mrs.

'B. S. Hubbard. Jr., Mrs. Ted
Groebl and Mrs. J. E. Hogan.

Mrs. Ralph Wyatt,
Holmes, J. P. Perkins. Mrs. W.

Fields. Mrs. Neel Barnaby, Mrs.
H. L. Autry, Mrs. Robert Stripling,
Mrs. Clyde Thomas. Jr.,
George Thomas and Mrs. Clyde
Johnson.

Pastor

Radio

School
Pastor

Eve. Pastor P.
Mid-We- ek Praise

count

Those Betty

J.
Coats,

Cobb,

Mrs.

Mrs.

Mrs.

Mrs.

Mrs.

introduced
Stripling,

tend the of her nephew

04

C

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH

Bible School 9:45 A.M.

Morning Service 10:50 A.M.

Subject: "Heaven'sSweetestWord"
Evening Service 7:30P.M.

Subject: "Christ Is Coming Again"

Christian Youth Fellowship 6:30 P.M.
Mid-We- ek Prayer Service Wednesday,7:30 P.M.

EVERYONE WELCOME
H. THOMPSON, Pastor

CHURCH OF CHRIST
1401 Main

HERBERT L. NEWMAN, Minister

SCHEDULE

SERVICES

AtWm
Af

zJsEM
LOSD'S DAY

Program KBST 8:15
First Service A.M.
Bible'School 10:00
SecondService 10:50A.M.
Preaching 7:00P.M.

MONDAY
Ladies' Bible Class 3:00P.M.

WEDNESDAY
Prayer Meeting 7:30P.M.

SBWBBBBBeSraeEiiV.c' v w
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MUK.-SLM- J WORSHIP 11:00 to
Things and Thincs Shalt Do."

EVENING WORSHIP 8.-- to 9:00l
The Way Made Acts

This Evangelistic Service will be by Baptism.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH

J

West Ward P-T-A

Elects Officers
Election of officers for the

year was held at the West

Ward Pareni-Teach-er Association
Thursday afternoon, but no defi
nite president was named.

Mrs. Y. Smith was
vice-preside- Mrs. E. T. Rey-

nolds, secretary; and Mrs. Cecil

Pcnick, treasurer. Installation of
officers will be held at the

High school gymnasium on May 5.
The unit voted to ten dele-

gates to the district conference in
Midland April 23 and 24.

Mrs. Penick showed two
health films, Guide to
Health" and "Right to Hear" as
the Her room won the
room count. The meeting was
opened with the repetition of the
Lord's Prayer in

Those were Mrs. J. P.
Boswell, Mrs. Durward Lewter,
Mrs. Howard Morgan, Mrs. T. L.
South, Mrs. W. L. Vaughn, Mrs.
E. T. Reynolds, Mrs. Lois D. Cos--
ton, Mrs. Bursell Johnson, Mrs.
Virgil Smedley, Mrs. C. R. Moad
and Mrs. L. F. Loper.

Mrs. Zollie Mae Rawlins, Mrs.
Jack Y. Smith, Mrs. Drake,
Mrs. A. B. West, Mrs. V. L. Per-
kins, Mrs. F. W. Medley,

Fielder, Mrs. E. B. Black-
burn, Jr., Mrs. Roy C. Anderson,
Mrs. Penick, Mrs. Jimmie
Mason, Mrs. Robert Hill and Mrs.
C. W. Kesterson.

ESA Sorority
Hears Mrs. Nabors

Mrs. 0. L. Nabors, beautician,
was guest at the Epsilon
Sigma Alpha Sorority Thursday
evening in the Settles hotel.

She on the careof the hair
and rinses, use i Saturdays

cosmetics and hair styling to ex
one's personality and sug

gestedhair styles for all the mem-
bers. She then answered questions
that were askedby the group. Mrs.

Mr. and Mrs. Worth Peeler Nabors was by Ruth
Friday afternoon for Bryan to at-- J program chairman.

wedding

. .

LLOYD

Street

-.

Radio . A.M.
9:00

A.M.

aS52K bbbbbbbbI

. 'TB

12:00
"These Greater Thou John 14:12

Plain" 16:31
followed

Jack elected

these

send

Cecil
"Modern

program.

unison.
present

Jack

Mrs.
Dick

Cecil

speaker

snake
from

press

Plans for a formal on May 1,
' Founders made. Aa Day, were com
mittee for arrangements for it was
named, inc committee is com
posed of Rhoda Miller, Mary Ann
Goodson, Peggy Uthoff and Ernes-
tine Ashley.

The sorority voted to donate the
proceeds from the box supper
which is being held in the VFW
hall tonight to the cancer fund
drive.

A system of local dues was In-

stituted.
Attending were Ruth Stripling,

Lavcrn Webb, Dorothy Day, Er-
nestineAshley, Mary Ann Goodson,
Rhoda Miller, Peggy Uthoff, Le--
atrice Ross, Claire Yates, Penny
Bowers, Stella Mae Wheat, Pat
Buck and Billie Jo Anderson.

Berta BeckettClass
Has Luncheon

Mrs. K. S. Beckett led in prayer
at the covered dish luncheongiven
by the Berta Beckett Sundayschool
class in the First Baptist church
Thursday noon.

The linen covered table was cen-
tered an arrangement lilac
and iris.

Following the luncheon, Mrs.
Jamie Hancock presided at the
business sessionand Mrs. L. B.
Adams and Mrs. J. P. Dodge led
in prayer.

Thoseattending were Mrs. E. D.
iKimberlln, Mrs. Jamie Hancock,
Mrs. Delia K. Agnell, Mrs. B. J.
Mangel, Mrs. B. N. Ralph, Mrs.
J. W. Wooten, Mrs. Creed Coffee,
Mrs. J. G. Hull, Mrs. L. M. Gary,
Mrs. J. P. Dodge. Mrs. W. R.

j Douglass, Mrs. Nat Snick, Mrs.
F. Sellers, Mrs. L. B. Adams, Mrs.
Hardy, Sarah Gibson and the fol-
lowing guests, Mrs. Zollie Mae
Rawlins and children, Mrs. Inez!
Lewis, Gloria Ann Freedman and
Mrs. K. S. Beckett.

Modern Bridge Club
Meets In Holbrook Home

Mrs. R. W. Halbrook entertained
members the Modern Bridge

at her home Thursday after-
noon, with guest high prize going
to Mrs. Alton Underwood.

Mrs. Al Aton won high member
and Mrs. Elvis McCrary and Mrs.
Hershal Petty bingoed.

A refreshment plate was served
to Mrs. John Brinner. Mrs. Elvis
McCrary, Mrs. R. W. Halbrook and
Mrs. Al Aton. members; and Mrs.
A. E. Underwood, Mrs. Clifford
Spillman, Mrs. E. J. Brooks and
Mrs. Hershal Petty, guests.

The Rev. and Mrs. John E. Kolar
are leaving to conduct revival
meeting in Muskogee,Okla. the
Church of God. On April 19 to
May 2 they are.holding two
weeks special revival and Institute
meeting for the Beatrice, Neb.
Chur.ch God. They will return
to Big Spring May 3.

BIG SPRING
VENETIAN BLINDS

CUSTOM BUILT
VENETIAN BLINDS

For Home and Office

Aluminum Awnings
1010 Gregg Ph. 2315

In Biq Sprinq Churches

Wesley Methodist
Plans To Observe
Annual Layman's Day
In observanceof Layman's Day program, a yearly affair, the Wes-

ley Methodist church wilL hold a morning program Sunday consisting
of discussionsby laymen of the church. Theme of the special ob-

servance is "Learning to Live A Christian Life," and the affair is un-

der direction of J. W. Garrison.
Having part on the program and scheduledto speak on assorted

phases of general topic are Laymen Howard Thompson, B. C.
Williamson, Ray Eckler and J. I. Low.

The Rev. Aubrey White, pastor of ,the Wesley Methodist church
will be heard over KBST at 8 a. m. Sunday speaking on "The Majesty
of the Commonplace." Subject
matter is taken from Matthew
15:34.

Guest speaker at 7:30 p. m.
sermon hour will be H. D. Norrls.

The Rev. Henry Thomas an
nounces that 11 a. m. services at
the Church of the Nazarenc Sun-

day will feature the reading of the
Rules of the Church, which are
required to be read before con
gregations eachyear. There will be
no morning sermon. The Rev.

Thomashas not announcedhis eve-

ning topic.

Sundaymassesat the St. Thomas
Catholic church are said at 7 and
10:30 a. m. and weekday masses
are scheduled at 7 a. m. daily.
Catholic rites sermon in Span-

ish will be said Sunday 8:30

and 10:30 a. m. at the Sacred
Heart Catholic church; weekday
mass is 7 a. m. Confessions are
heard before the daily mass or

benefits of the of 7 to 8:30 p. m.

left

with of
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at

a

of
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at
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Speaking on the theme "What
Will You Do With Jesus?" Mrs.
Olvy Sheppardwill conduct11 a. m.
services Sunday at the Dora Rob-

erts Citadel. Mrs. Sheppardselects
her text from Matthew 27:2. From
Matthew 7:14, Sheppard Long,
speakon the topic "Arc There Few
That Be Saved?" at the Salvation
Army services at 8 p. m

At the 10:50 a. m. sermonhour
at the Main Street Church of God
Sunday the Rev. J. E. Kolar, pas
tor, will discuss "Consecration."
He selectshis text from Acts 2:1--4

Following a sermonette at 7:30
p. m. based on Timothy 3:1-1-5, In
stallation ceremony for new offi
cers of the Missionary
Society will be held. Mrs. J. E.
Kolar is in charge. Young people

at 6:45 'p. m.

Guest speaker at Sunday serv-
ices at the Airport Baptist church
will be the Rev. R. A. Rowel,
ministerial student at Wayland col-
lege, Plainview. The Rev. Rowell
will appearat both the 11 a. m.
and 7:30 p. m. worship hours.

The Rev. Gage Lloyd, pastor of
the First Presbyterianchurch, will
speak Sunday on "Assimilation of
the New Church Members" at 11

a. m. Text is taken from Acts 2:47.
At 7:30 p. m. services, the pastor

is to talk on the theme, "JesusAs
a Friend," based on the scriptures
from John 19:5. Young people,
under leader Lillian Tamsitt, con
vene at 6 p. m.

Following Sunday school and
Bible class at 10 a. m. Sunday at
the St Paul'sLutheran church, the
Rev. A. H. Hoyer will give the
Morning Worship sermon from the
theme "The New Life Given Us By
the Risen, Living Savior."

"Are Sin, Disease, and Death
Real?"is the subject of the" Lesson-Sermo- n

which will be read at 11

ZXf I '

is

"if' "
37:23 and from page 472 of the
Christian Sciencetextbookby Mary
Baker Eddy.

a

Dr. C. A. Long, pastor of the
First Methodist church, announces
that will speak on "The Bal-
anced Christian Life" at the 10:50
sermon hour morning. Sub-
ject matter comesfrom II Timothy

7:30 p. m. Long's
will be "The Sufficient Remedy"
based on Jeremiah8:11.

The Rev. Marvin Clark, pastor
the Trinity Baptist church, will

speak at 11 m. Sunday on the
subject in Polluted
Dlnfin. Tt.. 1 '

iav-c-a. inc aerinon is oasca on
Micah 2:10. Sunday classes

to a series of studies
on the Baptist articles of faith,
Sunday's topic being "One True
God

The ceremony of Baptism and
the of the Lord's Sup-
per will follow the 7:45 p. m. serv-
ices. Sermon topic, based on
mans 4:1--5 and James 2:14-2- 6, is
entitled "Faith and Works."

the First Christian church
Sunday the Rev. Lloyd
will speak on the theme "Heaven's
Sweetest Word." the evening

, service me pastor continue
.'topics in a series, speaking on
"Christ Is Coming Again." A bap--

TRAVIS REED
& Ma

The Best Known
CannedGoods
Frozen Foods

Meats

711 Scurry Phone

6

tismal service will be held
mediately after the sermon.

im- -

Dr. P. D. O'Brien will discuss
the Quotation from John 14:12

"These things and greatenthings
shalt thou do" at the morning
service at the First Baptist church
Sunday.

In the evening the topic is to be
"The Way Made Plain" and the
text is Acts 16:31. The
service is to be followed by bap-
tismal service.

Circle Five
CoveredLuncheon

Members of Circle Five of the
Women'sSociety of Christian Serv
ice of the First Methodist church
had a covereddish luncheonThurs-
day at the church.

A short history of the Young
Women'sSocietywas given by Mrs.
Clyde Thomas, Sr., and a history
of Women's works was given by
Mrs. Herbert Keaton.

Those attending were Maxine
Lowery, Mamie Lee Dodds, Mrs.
Bob Moore, Mrs. T. M. Lawson,
Mrs. E. J. Hughes, Mrs. J. P.
Showen, Mrs. J. Boswell and
Mrs. J. Ashcraft.

Mrs. Stanley Cameron. Mrs.
Capt will Howard Morgan, Mrs. C. A.

Women's

convene

of

P.

Mrs. W. H. Reinwald, Mrs. Howard
Salisbury, Mrs. L. A. Webb, Mrs.
Gretchen Davis, Mrs. H. G. Keaton
and Mrs. Clyde Thomas, Sr.

Events
OF ''HE COMING WEEK

WOODMAN CIRCLE will meet at the
WOW hill at 7 30 p. m.

SUNBEAMS of First BaDtlit church will
meet at the church at 3 p m

HOWARD COUNTY HD COUNCIL will
meet at the Home Demonttrttlon of-
fice at 2 p. m.

ResidentsReturn
From Neel Rites

Relatives have returnedfrom at-
tending the funeral of Mrs. Mary
JaneNeel, 92, wife of the deceased
"Uncle Alex" Neel of Gustine, who

troop the
Mrs. Neel had been a member

of the Methodist church since she
was nine yearsof

Among the ten surviving chil
dren are Joe B. Neel and Mrs.
Fannie Barrett of Big Spring;
Mrs. Bertha Johnson of Midland;
and H. Neel of San Angelo.

Pallbearerswere the grandsons.
Among them were Julius and By-
ron Neel and Carl McDonald of
Big Spring.

New Lincolns Will
Be Unveiled Soon

S.W.; r"u Organization of a campaign and
selected from Isaiah 45:17. and fr?ngrTa!m1i0r anncITn8 the "ew

other citations which comprise the ""? T .1""! T
Lesson-Sermo- n are taken from Job lCAao "-1-

he

Sunday

1:7. At Dr. topic

a.
"Christians

school
are continue

observance
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At
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At
will
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Quality
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evangelistic

Has

W.

Saturday

M.

tory was effected at an area deal
crs meet at the Settles Friday.

Here for the affair was B. A.
Gibson, Dallas, manager of the
Dallas branch office.

The unveiling of the Lincoln mod-
els is set nationally for April 22.

Truman Joneswas the host deal-
er for the areameeting.Other deal-
er representatives were present
from Abilene, Lubbock, Lamesa,
Sweetwater, Odessa,Littlefleld and
San Angelo.

Mr. and Mrt. R. R. McEwen, Sr.,
are leaving Saturday for Yachats.
Ore., to spend the summer.

IIUlUlv FINEST 4mJ
for Every Purpose fc

Electric Machinery
& Equipment Co.

Repairing: Servicing:
Motors Belts - Pulleys

Motors Rewound

Herman Taylor
Nlte Phone 2155W

ao05 Gregg: Phone 2580

XYZ's Have Theme
Of April Showers

A theme of April Showers was
used by members of the XYZ's at
their dinner meeting, Thursday
evening,using miniature umbrellas
of pastel colors as favors and a
centerpiece of an umbrella of
spring flowers to complete the mo-

tif.
Hostesseswere Mrs. J. D. Jones.

Mrs. Ray Shaw, Mrs. Bill Funder-bur-k

and Mrs. Merrill Creighton.
Bridge and 42 were entertain-

ment with Mrs. Tommy Hutto as
high score winner of bridge and
Mrs. W. D. Caldwell, high at 42.
Mrs. Arthur Caywood won bingo at
bridge and Mrs. Vernon Logan won
bingo at 42.

Those present were Mrs. Arthur
Caywood, Mrs. H. E. Choate, Sr.,
Mrs. Tommy Hutto, Helen Duley,
Maxine Bruce, Mrs. A. A. Arcand,
Mrs. W. L. Slate, Mrs. Carl Gross,
Mrs. J. O. Hagood, Mrs. Vernon
Logan, Mrs. Elvis McCrary and
Ruth Jane Hartzog.

Mrs. A. McNary, Mrs. A. A.
Marchant, Mrs. G. G. Morehead,
Mrs. W. N. Norred, Mrs. R. B.
Reeder, Mrs. V. A. Whittington.
Mrs. Harvey Wooten, Mrs. Bill
Younger. Mrs. Bill Johnson, Fran-
ces Forte, Mrs. J. D. Jones, Mrs.
Ray Shaw, Mrs. Bill Funderburk,
Mrs. Merrill Creighton and Mrs
W. D. Caldwell.

TEL Class Has
Dinner At Church

The TEL Class of the First Bap
tist church met for a covered dish
dinner Thursday evening at the
church with Mrs. K. S. Beckett,
class mother, giving the opening
prayer.

Mrs. E. D. Rose gave the de-

votional from Daniel 1:8-1-4.

Mrs. O. L. Nabors gave two
solos, "A Red Red Rose" and
"You." She was accompanied by
Mrs. S. A. Ritter.

Mrs. J. W. Cain presided at the
business meeting at which time
secret pals were revealed.

Rufroenmanf e timi.o 4.
Young People's Department

tDe apustcnurch en--

Mrs. E. D. Rose. Mrs.G. W. Mar
tin, Mrs. H. H. Squyres,Mrs. K. S.
Beckett, Mrs. R. D. Ulrey, Mrs.
J. W. Cain and Mrs. C. E. Read.

Mrs. C. E. Richardson, Mrs. Be-
atrice Mittel, Mrs. L. E. Coleman,
Mrs. C. G. Varnell, Mrs. W. H.
Claeborne and Mrs. S. A. Ritter.

Eager BeaversMeet
In ProctorHome

Tho Eager Beaver club met In
the home of Mrs. Clarence Proctor
for handwork Thursday afternoon.

Secret pal gifts were exchanged.
Mrs. R. B. Riddle is to be next

hostess.
Attending were Mrs. Denver

Yates. Mrs. R. I. Findley, Mrs.
Roy Spivey, Mrs. A. F. Johnson;
Mrs. R. B. Riddle, Mrs. H. D. Bru-to-n,

Mrs. Ben Jernigan,Mrs. Ola
Franklin, Mrs. W. L. Clayton and
Mrs. C. W. Cotton.

Kiwani QueensWill
SponsorScout Troop

Members of the Kiwani Queens
to sponsor Mrs. W. D. Row

'. vus land's girl scout 21 at

age.

cammfl

meeting Thursday noon in the home
of Mrs. Jack Roden.Mrs. Harry J.
King was ss to the covered
dish luncheon.

The next meeting Is to be coke
party in the home of Mrs. B. E.
Freeman with Mrs. H. W. Smith
as

Those present were Mrs. Merle
Stewart, Mrs. Horace Reagan,Mrs.
J. A. Coffey, Harvey Clay.
Mrs. B. E. Freeman, Mrs. Herbert
Whitney. Mrs. Walter Read, Mrs.
H. Smith and the hostesses.

Mr. and Mrs. Noble Read re-
turned Sunday from Dallas where
they visited their new grandson
W. W. Gunn. Ill, and other rela-
tives and friends.

Mrs. F. G. Powell and her moth-
er, Mrs. C. A. Schull returned

from Denison where they
attended the funeral Mrs.
Schull's brother-in-la- N. E. High
tower.

(TO0lE-DE-0E-e to
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Jastone easy changein the can-
ning and freezing syrupsyou prepare,
and you'll get the finest fruit you
ever put "up. Finer for flavor, color,
texture better in every respect.

FREE Book Gives Details

Thousandsupon thousandsof
women have tried and proved this
amazingly better way fully ex-

plainedin the 1948 Edition of the fa-

mousbook, "Finer CannedandFrozen
Fruits." Also in this big, FREE book
you'll find page after pageof recipes,
tips on relishes, pickles, preserves.It's

handbook of valuable canning
and freezing information for begin-
ners, experts, everybody.

SEND COUPON TODAY

HELEN Dept 3A
P. O. Box 4573
Plaza St. Louis 1

Missouri
Send me FREE our
book, ' "Finer Canned and
Frozen Fruits".

Name
Street
City & Zone State
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Rev. Henry Thomas Is

SpeakerAt East Ward
The Rev. Henry C Thomas worth, Mrs. Nathan Stalcup, Mr.

opened the meeting of the East p. K Pitzert Mrs- - j w Ue
Ward Parent-Teach-er Association The Rev' and JIrs-- Henry Thom'at the school with a prayer Thurs--
day afternoon. j as airs-- Henry Fehlerr Mrs. J.t D.

Mrs. A. J. Cain urged all mem-- j Jenkins, Edith Wright, Elfa
bers to form the habit of daily Schrank. Mrs. H. A. 3Iorris, Mrs.
pra for world peace. She fur-'-J B. Thomas, Mrs. Leon West,
thcr ted that, "Instead of the,Neal Cummings, and E. B. Black- -
pra 'Now I Lay me down tolulun.
Slec, we should plead, 'Now I
Get me up to Work."

Plans were completed for the
silver tea to be held at the school,
Thursday, April 29 from 3:30 to
5 p. m.

The second grade students en-

tertained with Mother goose read-
ings, prior to the business ses--

Ision, at which time reports were
read by Mrs. Joe Thurman and
Mrs. J. D. Jenkins.

Members were reminded that all
pre-scho- ol children will be given a
free medical examinationthis aft-
ernoon at 3:30 p. m. at the First
Methodist church.

Attending the meeting were Mrs.
A. J. Cain, Mrs. H. A. Rogers.
Mrs. Joe Thurman, Mrs. Aelin Gif-ford- ,

Mrs. Alene McClentack, Mrs.
M. D. Tarkhill, Mrs. Weldon Mc- -
Clanahan.Mrs. Will Vaughan,Mrs.
Walter Smyrl, Mrs. FredE. Lowke,
Mrs. Gordon Clements, Mrs. Owen
Morton, Mrs. Tom Buckner, Mrs.
Joe Jacobs.

Pauline Buckner, Mrs. C. W Ma-hone-y,

Mrs. A. M. Sessions,Mrs.
B. O. Lummlngs. Mrs. Miller Rus-
sell, Mrs. A. C. Kloven. Mrs. Floyd
Bell, Mrs. Raymond Key, Lorena
Brooks, Mrs. J. L. Miller, Mrs. U.
G. Powell, Alna Porch, Mrs. R L.
Glaser, Mrs. A. G. Carsen, Mrs.
E. F. Russell, Mrs. B. F. EUs--

Young People's
Has Wiener Roast

Mrs o t. Nshor Mr. ai.,,. o: lrst wasVieregge, Mrs. Fred

voted

a

Mrs.

W.

Thursday
for

a

HOLMES,

Sta.,

Dept.

" ' ATffnArl rTtlt(1ar nifAnSnrt 4l .
h-- a tjti.u A&.uxouajr eveuiug wiui a
wiener roast at Seven Wells.

Those attending were Marlene
Burnett, Billy Ralney, Bill Blalack,
Jane Brookshire, Babs Snyder,
Raymond Moore, Phil Grozier, NI-d- ra

Williams, Marjorle Moore. Ma-
mie Jean Meador, Mr. and Mrs.
Preston Denton, Mr. and Mrs. Loy
House, Elvin and Loyette.

Royal Neighbors Are
Asked To Attend Meeting

AH members of the Royal Neigh-
bors were asked to attend the Dis-

trict Convention In Wink. April 29.
at the meeting in the WOW hall

I Thursday.
Members attending were Mrs. D

S. Orr, Mrs. Shelly Hall, Mrs. J.
T. Byers, Mrs. JesseMcClanahan
and Mrs. Claude Wright.
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Ihow to bake!
ia cake like!
1 grandmother!
JUSED TOMAKEl

SHOPS.

GOLDEN
DELICIOUS

APPLE CAKI
Yt tcupooo each oftrouad d

mmoa, and albpte
Yi teaspoonoda Y cupcold watar

z teaspoon vanilla
Vt cap ahottentnt

cup Granulated
tus W cups floor

H teaspoonsalt
I cup fresh apple, peeled, cored. aa4

chopped to about thesin of pea

MIX salt, spices and lift
Dissolve in water.

Cream shortening; gradually add
Imperial Granulated Sugar, con
tinuing to cream.Add eggswhich
have been beatenuntil very light.
Beat mixture thoroughly about
30 Add dry ingredientsal-
ternatelywith apple and thenwith
cold water. Add vanilla. Pour
two greasedand floured

pans.Bake in moderateovea
(350 F.) for 30 minutes. Put
frosting betweenlayer andon top
and tides of cake. This is very
moist cake with excellent keeping
qualities.
To be sure of
the finru olPurtCmxt..
demandImptritl Pint
Cnt Suit. It's pint
cent, tttl ctnt ...ud
quick-diuotrinj- e. Im-
perial Sunar refined
right here In Texas.
You know it's 100
purecane.

Irlal'Mli'NLl

TaaBBBaW laVl M aWaV aLw M aT JLbLLbM

Vbbbb m T

P&JRW IWIIIOLlffl

4"fI cubesnm lit!

I BBmXi''ik. INbW

f rBBvC --i&K

I Amml xfSf
J Style no. 1605Flf r 'Wk V--F

'Cmp eooT-plK- rl Oavarty deu'gfttd 'tqvortd-fitek- '. fined jotJc'
matdiMfl Iriih-ty- f loc irjfflming If t smartcap sletrttend ofl i

WW

Oftd

with BrotMef

paptum. Gored tkirt with zip-ti- d ploektt. FJower-frej- h shadesof gnns

aquaor ongel white. Sizes 9 to 15.

IF YOU CANNOT COME IN PERSONAll Y TO SHOP,YOU MAY
CONVENIENTLY Y MAIL FROM OUR CENTRAL WAREHOUSE '

Enclosed

SALU ANN Dtpt. S-- 53

1409 Washington St. Louis 3, Mo

CO. O..

SIzerot each, plus pottoge. 1
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nutmeg

1 Imperial Sugar
2 nitad
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twice. soda cold

seconds.

into
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Attaching Entirely To Much Prestige
Tbenextbig hurdle for republicanpresi-

dential aspirantsappears to be the Ne-

braska primary. Harold Stassen has
openedthe eyesof observersby reason of
his showing in Wisconsin. GeneralMacAr-thu-r

hashad chilling waterstossedon his
boom, and ThomasDewey hasbeenforced
to make a fight for his political life.

Sen. Robt Taft alone escapedmarking
of somedegree,and thatbecause hestayed
out of the Wisconsinprimary. In string
out, he also cut himself out of any dele-

gates. It was a swapof face for delegates.
This will not be possible in Nebraska,
where all the others, including even Sen.
Vandenberg,who sayshe isn't running at
all, areentered.

A great deal of ballyhoo will attend the
Nebraskaeffort. Sen Taft has just re

Lewis' InescapableResponsibility
Results of the President's fact-findin- g

board indicate that JohnL. Lewis precipi-

tated thecoalstrike without duereasonor
regard for national welfare.

After making a point-by-poi- nt examina-
tion of the claims and counter-claim-s, the
board concluded that the terms of the
miners' welfare fund werebeinghandledas
per agreement,that the failure to make
onereplacementwas wholly due to inertia
or indifference of Mr. Lewis, and that the
proposal of S100 per month to every re--

tired miner past 60 j'ears of age, regard-
less of whetherhe worked for a company
covered by the welfare fund, was not
economicallysound.

Thereseemedto be no logical reasonfor
promising protection beyond the abilities

a
it

a

a

The

8, CS-V- a of fact--1 a judge to Issue a
This will try to unsnarl the j finders to look order a re--

up to date It's mov-- Hcn the the stra,nIng and
lua 10 a iuuuuu). : 311 mc aim mi-s-i

understand what's ' ask a
bo far. and will keep judge a

key in an injunction to at
1. The cause of the coal mine least SO days.

shutdown pensions. After eight
months of arguing Lewis and the
mine couldn't agree on

pensions.
So on March 12 Lewis told the

miners owners --had "dishon-
ored" their working contract The
miners March 15
haven'tbeenbacksince.

The question; refused.
strike? Lewis argues that the min
ers are not striking. He says

simply not "willing"
irork.

The Taft-Hartl-ey labor law.
Lewis hates it. last sum

on

to

2. or no a

to

3.

mer, that when to stop.
decides a strike threat--, back.

then I 3 I

Affairs The World DeW'rtt MacKenzie

to
j

as ce--1 be
In first

into j in
the with

On the face of it that
seem so. is
no question
more to

of that very fact it
the is to

the prcservaUoa of
as It may

in the cases of the
independent of Bulgaria,
Romania, Yugoslavia, Hungary,

and Czechoslovakia.
at sweating the

-
Anyway, let's this

move more carefully

TexasToday William Barnard

a new
a rootin'-tooti- n square-jowe-d

attractive
eyes.

Her name is
and a

G. Longview
newspaperman,

an interview.
"Dangerous McGrew." said

in his the

Longview cashj
The concusIve

are
outlawing

In the country."
of

Crawford hire
to the law.

He her and
receptionist. The said

"a
advantageous to

feel that we
progressive in

ing iess

is
Her grandparents were

the that
the war she

in FBI in Washington.
Her husband,

the war, employed by
gas and His

has his per-
mission to be

first in
an instantan-

eous hit the
said.

counterparts prop
on the

at the spittoons
as as in the

and come.

big

Of

C.

has

and

turned Dewey is speak-
ing fervently; Harold Stassen is headed
that So be said

it, preferential balloting
proportions perhaps of

boundsof significance.
it is desirable primaries
to afford measure of popular

choice in selectionof nominees, is all
radio to all

too far beyond importance.
Doubtless resultsin or pri-
maries reflect geenral

are so localized fac-
tors it is unfair to accept this as an
iron-cla- d However, an.overdoseof
publicity can impressions, which,
though alwaysjustified, are accepted.

danger attachingtoo
prestige to primary

of to produce, as calculated
actuaries, it was merely case
of cold mathematics. As if weren't
enough,allowances to be set up

accident benefits, further
mitigating against demand of Lewis.
Maximum benefits for miners are to be
desired; not beyond financial possi-
bility.

do operators are guile-
less not trying
short-cut- s hedging, main,

was sufficient for
to his miners contract

"dishonored." He cannot escape
responsibility for precipitating the stop.-pag-e,

although not said to
strike. It amountsto

Nation Today JamesMarlon

Bringing Lewis Case Up To Date
WASHINGTON", Ke must appoint board got

John into the temporary called
board finishes. order-tell- ln8

auunuuun
To happened Government lawyers must

happen, for court
mind: stop the strike

quit

they're

go the
On 24 the

was nine old
set up his fact-findin- g

The law says the board
can

it. The
the

The up but Lewis
big Strike

had to him to go the
he did.

The to Mr.
that

12 the
had

it says the Presi-ithe-m

dent didn't go
Still the

ens the public On April government day,

Looking Behind Red-Finnis-
h Pact

The new Busso-Finnis- h and not conclusions.There
aid has been described by are days wishful

Finnish politicians can mighty
the little Baltic the should

tighter the eastern bloc but Moscow
preserving dealing Finland? Well, for
signty.

would
.to be Certainly there

about Finland being
Emily bound Russia.

strikes me wish father
about

just have
been fiercely

states

Poland Look
them now,

yoke!
examine lat-

est Russian

Gregg County deputy
sheriff

little colleen with
Irish

Mrs. Marion Tay-

lor she's Dallas
dressmodeL

Zoppi.
waxed enthusias-

tic in
Dan

Zoppi. "would dead
tracks. Even Dalton

boys would have twicer

step

in

an

with most

to

for

the

not

not

the

with

of

rush

"We

first

not

to go
than by
and the
to up a of that sort
at this

too. the
to put their best side

of the
in forthcoming

of
is
for in to com--j

and thus
In

this also Is true of

And and ties worn
of just

sort of impressed,
gave the a of

and
in directions.

raiding any The are provid-bo- x.

fag as a practical test
Gregg like a hot ,as we to et of aSam Bass

have done all up mental question, which is much In

Yankee
As a matter fact,

Sheriff Noble didn't
Taylor enforce

hired as a secretary
a sheriff
he figured feminine touch"
would prove his

have taken a
really employ

a woman
stated.

Mrs. a Texan, from
Henderson.
among settlers
region. During

office
an pilot

during is
a electric
wife, he says,

a deputy sheriff.
"The female deputy

Gregg County made
even

male deputies," Zoppi
"Her male don't

desks
aim tobacco juice

often they did past

They owners

from there; Gov.

way. much will and done
about that
will assume out

real
While that such

be held

easy press and build them
their real

three four
will some trends,

yet there often many
that

front.
create

That is the much
this and that.

the fund by
with whom

this
had for

sick and
the

but

We say that
and that somewere above

and but in
there reason Lewis

'write that the had
been

he may be have
called that just the
same.

April federal
dispute,

IjewIs case Lewis
iuumhui-b-,

what federal order
these three points

owners
miners

the

Passed

full

their

Now story.
March when mine

days Presi-
dent Truman

board.
compel witnesses appearbe-

fore board ordered Lewis

owners showed
Finally, federal judge

order before
board. Then

board finally reported
Truman letter March

three days min-
ers stopped "induced"

miners

welfare, lawyers

mutual--.
treaty when thinking

leading dangerous,
menting republic place, why

drop cave-ma-n tactics
country's sovcr--i

How-
ever, because

thought
freedom

under
Soviet

smiling

former

Anthony

have stopped

thought

though,

office.

deputy,'

worked

Army

company.

walkout

Lewis'
before

work

one thing the Finns likely would
prefer down fighting rather

accept servitude treaty
Bolshevists can't afford

stir conflict
criUcal juncture.

Then, Muscovites are
anxious for-
ward for the benefit Italian
Communists the
national election. Control Italy

a strategic prize without price
Russia her drive

munize Western Europe
dominate the entire continent.
lesserdegree
France.

coats are being
instead khaki shirts."
Zoppi was

too. He lady pair
sixguns posedher aiming them

two

And

about Italian elecUons
Jamesboys would have

shunned County
lik funda"potato and old would

his

Mrs.

Taylor,

stub-
born

up

the

too

in

dispute amongstudentsof the Com-

munist movement. The question is
whether the Communists can rule
any European nation without the
support of the Red Army.

For thirty years, during the
whole time in which the Commu-
nist movement has beenin active
force, no country-- has ever been
5iih!iiPafpf1 hv fhi f!nmmnnlct nn.. j e --, w .......... ....

urawiora, the Russian Army was able

feet

to intervene decisively. After the
first world war local Communists
seized power in Hungary, in parts
of Germany, in northern Italy, and
in various other scattered places.
They were soon overthrown. The
Soviet Union was unable to give
them military support, and the na-

tive Communists plus the Russian
agents were unable to hold power
against the nationalist forces and
tho national armies.

In the interval between the two
wars, western Europe remained
democratic and capitalist, central
and eastern Europe, with the ex-
ception of the Czechoslovak de--

the miners to go back to work.
This order was to be in effect

10 days. After that the judge could
decide whether to issue the 80-da-y

no-stri- order called for in the
Taft-Hartle- y law.

But, during those 10 days, the
judge expectedLewis and the min-
ers to obey bis order to go back to
work. The miners still stayed
away. And yesterday three things
happened, bringing the showdown
next Monday:

1. The government moved to get
Lewis held in contempt of court.

2. Lewis askedthe judge to throw-ou-t

the temporary, no-stri- ke order.
3. The government asked for a

more permanent, 80-da-y no strike
order.

The federal judge will start act
ing on those three requests Mon--

So Moscow is using Finland as
a mirror to reflect the sun of
Soviet beneficence and thereby
blind free nations to what is going
on. Actually the natureof the sh

treaty doesn't alter
one iota the fact that Moscow can
take over the little country any
time It wants to.

Moscow regardsFinland as an
essential base for defense of Rus-
sia's northern wing. The red line
across Central Europe was con-
solidated when Russia took over
Czechoslovakia. It remained to
deal with the northern andsouth-
ern wings Finland in the north,
and the Iranian-Turkish-Gree- k'

zone on the south. Finland will
have been taken care of if her
parliamentratifies the new treaty.
The fate of the southernwing is

I on the knees of the gods.

Colleen Bodes Evil For Lawbreakers
The resulting picture wasn't ex-

actly menacing, but the newspa-
perman sail 'The way she handles
those six shooters may make' po
tential law breakers think 'twice
before meddlin' with the law in
East Texas."

Today Tomorrow Walter Lippmann

Italy Faces Acid Test
however dislocated and impover-
ished, went Communist

After the second world war the
Red Army advanced to the center
of Europe. All the countries behind
it, and envelopedby it, have been
brought under Communist domina
tion. But as yet no European coun-

try has gone Communist which
.was not occupiedor surroundedby
the Red Army.

Italy is, therefore, a crucial test
as to whether or not the limits of
Communist expansion in Europe
(the backward parts of Asia may
present a different problem) are
the boundaries of the Red Army.
For Italy is not occupied like Hun-
gary, Romania and Bulgaria, or
surrounded likePoland, Czechoslo-
vakia, or dominated strategically
like Yugoslavia and Finland. Italy
is, on the contrary, within the mili-
tary orbit of the West.

If, then theItalian nation and the
Italian government surrendered to
Communist rule, Italy will be the
first country where the Communist
fifth column alone, separated from

mocracy, were authoritarian or the four columns of the Red Armv.
FascistBut no European country, has ever captured a modern state.

"BUTTERFINGERS!"
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Drew

One for ourselves against attempts to
unification of the Army and Navy

was to kill the bitter jealousy be-

tween the rival lobbies which each
maintained on Capitol Hill. For
years the admirals and the gen-

erals had their
scrambling around Congress try-

ing to woo votes and sniping at
each other In the scramble for

It was hoped that unification
would end this tug-of-w-

However, this column has now
obtained a secretmemo circulated
by the Navy which indicates that
Army-Nav-y warfare has not
stopped. If anything, it's more in-

tensive and bitter.
The Navy's amazing memo is

behind tho current battle over in-

creasing the Air forces to 70
groups. It frankly admits that if
.the admirals stick to their old
theory that the Navy's function Is
.to control the seas, it will soon
be obsolete.

Secretary of Defense Forrestal,
himself a Navy man, and who
has ship's clocks and portholes as
accoutcrments of his office, has
sided with the Navy and is opposed
to the 70 air groups urged by Air
Secretary Symington.

The dispute now boils down to
the question of which arm of the
service is best equipped to deliver
the atomic bomb against the en-e'm-y.

Argument in favor of the
airplane carrier as the best atom
deliverer Is put forward in the
Navy's memo extensively cir-
culated on Capitol Hill. Omitting
the military secrets, pertinent por
tions of this amazing document fol
low:

"NAVY HAS BEEN
ON DEFENSIVE"

"Memorandum for the Deputy
Chief of Naval Operations, Air
"Subject: Comment on Final Re-
port 'War Department Policies and
Programs Review Board.'

"Subject report circulated with-
in the Navy contains certain

of im-

portance to the Navy. This report
obviously represents the top-lev-el

thinking of the Army and Air
forces on the concept of future
war.

"It appears that this report con-
templates only a minor role in
future wars for the Navy, and
particularly for naval aviation.

tConcept of war envisaged in this
document is that of a strategic
bombing attack on the enemy con-

ducted by the Air Force from over-
seas bases.

"Publication of this report af-

fords the Navy an excellent oppor-
tunity to present its case as be-

ing the branch of the national de-

fense destined to deliver the
atomic bomb. Ever since the end
of the war, the Navy has been on
the defensive and has been an
swering arguments of those who
say that navies are obsolpte and
useless. We have been protecting

REPRESENTATIVE.
Bank Dallas Texas.
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WashingtonMerry-Go-Roun- d Pearson

Army-Nav-y Feud As Bitter As Ever
WASHINGTON reason

representatives

appropriations.

rec-
ommendations

the Navy the original
mergerproposal.

"For the past two years our de-

fense of the Navy has beenbased
mainly on old familiar arguments
about exercising control of the

warfare, naval re-

connaissance, protection of ship-
ping, arid amphibious operations.
It has been assumed,at im- -

plfcity, that the next war will not
be much different from the last
one. This assumption is basically
wrong, and If we stick to It the
Navy will soon be obsolete.

"The next war will be a lot
different from any previous one.
It seems obvious that the next
time our Sunday will be
an atomic bomb aimed at the en-

emy capltols or Industrial centers
and that tho outcome of the war
will be determined by strategic
bombing. The war will be won by
whichever side is able to deliver
the atomic bomb to the enemy,
and at the same time protect its
own territory against similar de-

livery. I think 'the time is right
now for the Navv to start an ag
gressive campaign aimed at prov- -
ing tnat the Navy can deliver the
atom bomb more effectively than
the Air Forces can.'
"THE .NAVY'S .PLATFORM"
"If the Navy delivery of

the atomic bomb Its major mis-
sion, and if we develop the proper
ships, planes and tactics, the Navy
can become theprincipal offensive
branch of the national defensesys-
tem the branch which actually
delivers Trans-- able to match

which of carriers
come home is not prac
tlcable, and I that as
far ahead as we can now see into
the future, the Navy can be In a
better to deliver bomb

the Air Forces can. That
should be the Navy's platform.

"To land our Sunday punch, it
Is just as important to have a de--

In Hollywood Bob

OB

is getting a lot of free advice on

career these days and is

promptly ignoring it all.
is me I

should protect he says.
"They say I've just been connected
with two hit pictures, I've had an
academy nomination and a cuc-cessf-ul

stage Now I

should make a sure-fir- e box-offic- e

picture. I say nuts to that."
I saw John in office at

terprise studios. lutics as a
producer haven't yet erased the
dreamy glint in eyes. His eyes
gleam and hands make short,
stabbing motions in the air as he
describes his ambitions.

"I just finished playing four
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pendable means of delivery as It
is to have the bomb itself . . . .

(The memo then gives the
Navy's view that B-2- and B-3-

are inadequate to bomb a distant
enemy.)

Is-- usual assume that we
will be able to use England as a
base in the next war. It may, or
may not, prove correct. If the
enemy also has. the b, Eng
land may be forced to remain
neutral,, and It is difficult to con
ceive of any enemy allowing it-

self to .get into an all-o- ut shooting
with until he does have

the
"So must make our long-rang-e

plans-- on the
that we do not have overseas
bases when the war breaks out.

"These o'versoas bases would be
almost impossible to defend. The
Ideal type of base Is a highly mo-
bile one, one which could be here
today and 500 miles away from
here tomorrow. If is a base which
could- - be in the Arctic one
attack-- and in the
the next week, and in the Persian
Gulf the week after.

The base which we have been
discussing above is of course the
aircraft carrier. The carrier can
transport bomber across the
ocean and launch it 1,000 miles
from its target. Instead of build
ing transoceanic range into the
bomber, and thereby penalizing
its performance over enemy terri-
tory, we build a
range into the carrier.

"The Air Forces will never be
the knockout blow. the performance

oceanic bombing by planes our with the

believe for

position the
than

Thomas

his

his En
His

his
his

paper

errors
after

their
amount them space

Issue paper

9,

"It

war

for

the

bomber. The same
will apply to mis-
siles versus guided
missiles.

(ED. NOTE The of
the Navy's memo the
air force will follow in an early
column.
(Copyright 1918. by Bell Syndicate. Inc.)

Garfield Ignores Advice
John Garfield months in an experimental play,

"Everybody
myself,"

The Big Spring Herald

AU

case

(Texas) Herald,

to
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we
assumption

transoceanic

transoceanlc
ship-launch- ed

transoceanic

remainder
opposing

HOLLYWOOD

engagement.

Mediterranean

'Skipper Next to God'," he de-

clared. (He reportedly earned a

microscopic S10 per performance
for his services.)

"We put the play on because
we thought it was worth trying."

"The moviesneed somethinglike
the experimental theater. People
out here areafraid to take chances.
They keep doing things in the con-

ventional way. They 'protect
themselves'."

Far from seeking protection,
Garfield is sticking his neck 'way
out. He is shoving his "Body and
Soul" profits (estimate: $600,000)
back into his producing company
for a new film, "Tucker'sPeople,"
a story of the numbers racket. Not
only is he gambling on an off-be-at

story, but he Is giving writer Ab
raham Polonsky his first directo
rial chore. "Protect myself haw!
commented Garfield.

John leaves this week for New
York locations on "Tucker's," then
leturns to finish the film. Then
he'll do a picture for 20th-Fo- x or
MGM. he said. "I almost slipped
and said a 'commercial' picture,"
he smiled.

"Winter Meeting" (WB) can best
be termed a Bette Davis picture.
This time she is a Yankee spinster
in a brief but frenzied . romance
with a naval hero (Jim Davis.)
Talky to the extreme, its action
is almost limited to lighting cig-
arettesand drinking coffee. Some
customers will find in it a certain
fascination, akin to reading other
people's love letters

Aroynd The Rim By The Herald Staff

Power Behind 0'Daniel j
For persons who may be" biting

their nails and otherwise showing
signs of impatience over W. Lee
(Pappy) O'Danlel's political status
this year, here Is some vital Infor-
mation picked up by chance', which
should at least give an Idea of the
strength the senator can fxfajbit
this year If he should make-u-p

his mind to test it at the polls.
My informant, who backs up his

claims of inside knowledge with a
peculiar bit of logic, is inclined to
disagree with recentopinion polls.
In fact, he says O'Daniel's strength
has undergonevirtually no change
during the past 10 or 12 years.

Furthermore,he flatly predicts
for Pappy, provided, of

course, the senator decides to list
his name on the ballot. At the same
time my source of information be-

lieves that an announcement for
is certain to come, but

he Is not as sure of that as he is of
the outcome of an election with
Pappy in the race

My political op-- 1 again." WACIL McNAIR

Hal Boyle's Notebook

The Ape Still Wins Out
NEW YORK, 8. tf-- Ever I stomped into a men's sa

get tired of hearing friend wife
say accusingly:

"I spent the whole afternoon In
the beauty shop and you didn't
even the difference?"

Sure you have. What did you
do about it? Nothing, of course.

Eves have the same incompa
rable creature ask you as you start-
ed off to work:

"Why do you keep trying to give
your boss theImpression you are
the bottom sack In the laundry
truck?"

Of course you have. What did
you do about it? Again nothing.
Listen to the tale of a man who
did try:

One-- day this week as I lunged
toward the door after breakfast
to catch the 8:21 Vt a. m., bus,
I mumbled at Frances:

"How I look, honey? Okay?"
"Sure, just like Bushman as us-

ual," she said.
"Who's Bushman?" I asked as

I sprinted out the door.
"That Chicago fashion plate you

try to imitate," she said.
It was only after I got on the bus

I remembered who Bushman
is. He's the famous gorilla at the
Lincoln Park Zoo. That made me
mad. So I thought I would show
her. I figured I could ouUook any
ape.

I got off the bus at the Grand
Central Palace where some 70.,-0-00

beauty parlor operators are
staging the international beauty

Broadway Jack (Brian

Quiz For Mazda Lane
Just asking

if I don't know, how come all the
regular Broadway angels-ar-e bid
ding to Invest In Irving Berlin's
new Hasn't Irene M.
Selznick been a smart producing
cookie In signing all her east in
"A StreetcarNamed Desire" for
another full year?

Isn't Leland Hayward a real
smartle,producing the movie ver

of his "Mister Roberts" on
his own, simply by hiring a Liber-
ty Ship and shootingthe scenesen
tirely on board, with the entire
Broadway cast Henry Fonda,
David Wayne Included?And
shouldn't he buy Alfred HItihcock
a good cigar for giving the
idea with no strings?
. Aren't three more Broadway
clubs scheduled to close before
summer?...And isn't
businessthe worst In a decade?...
Why doesn't Leon Enken, the gus-
tatory brains of Leon and Eddie's
before he parted with his singing
partner Eddie Davis, open a res
taurant on Broadway as several
smart backers have offered?

Won't the strip teasing on 52nd
Street remove all the valid color
from that stridentthoroughfare?...
And isn't Greenwich Village steal-
ing the hot jazz virtuosi right out
from under the noses of the 52nd
Street owners while they're watch-
ing duds drop?...What ever hap-
pened to John Garfield's to
remainwith "Skipper Next to God"
for a year, and then make the
movie version right in New York?

Won't George Abbott take over
the abandoned "Bonanza Bound"
and try to doctor it into a hit

Today's

Birthday
Paul Robeson,born April 9,

1898 at Princton, N. J., is Ameri-
ca's most famous Negro actor
and singer. His"'
best known'

w.i.a iuc uui'i
ello" and Bru-
tus Jones in
"The Emperorj!
Jo n e s". Ed.u-- j
cated in law and;

to the?
New York bar,
he dropped aj
law career be--i
cause he con
sideredthe color

- 1

.BSSHiBSSSSSSmt

PlwW
lb Wl iofsHV 4

sHr"M
bar would ham-- p' Robtjon

per his In 1947 he an-

nounced he would abandonthe
theatre and concert stage for
two years 'to up and down
the nation against race hatred
and prejudice". He Is .corchair--,
man of the Natioflar"WaTIa"ce" for
PresidentCommittee.

erates a thriving business ia
neighboring city, cannot be identfl
fled to the public for obvious real
sons,but his methodof reachingJ
conclusionon this political questioil
can. be recorded in print, without
serious complications. ,

In a recent conversation witk
me, he began with a simple state-
ment: "I know that 0DanieI will
be .re-elect-ed if he requestsit be-
cause I plan to vote for him.

When I asked how he accumu--.
lated such political power, he
shook his head and said it was
just as big a mystery to him as it
was to anyone else.

"But I am thoroughly convinced
I have this power," he said.

UI have talked with a numberof
voters right in my home town and
many more from other points, but
I have yet to find one who sup-
ported O'Daniel in his last race.
So, if my vote was sufficient to
put him in before, I see no reasoa
why it shouldn't be successful

observer, who

April show.

notice

that

plans

talk

Ion and found Saul Meth, a make--'
up artist and hair stylist ;

"Give me the whole menu," I
said, "from soup to nuts."

"That means," he said, "a
haircut, manicure, :hamp6o;
shave, mud pack, tonic, sunlamp'
treatment, shoe shine and a cold'
permanent wave."

That slowed me up.
"I don't know about that mud--

pack and permanent wave busi-
ness," I hesitated.

"Don't be foolish," he said. "The.
mudpack will take the grime from
your skin and leave it glowing;
like a baby. Your hair is getting
thin on top. The'wave will make ifc
look like you got twice as much
hair."

Three hours after I climbed la
to the chair I steppedforth a new
and changed man. That's what
Saul Insisted.

"You've got the new maseulia
look all right," he assured oe.

That, evening I went home all
set to surprise Frances witk
my new ultra-mal-e glamor.

"Still think J. look like your
" I asked, giving her

a full view of my mudpack-sof-tene-d

profile.
She looked me over critically.
"No," she said. "Bushman

doesn't wear a suit that needs
pressing like you do.

How can you win?
The moral: You might is well

tell your wife you spent the after-
noon in a beauty shop," too." She
can't tell the difference either.

NEW YORK As musical?...The way Jed Harrii'

musical?...

sion

him

Broadway

admitted

advance.

that

took the flop "WashingtoBSquare,"
added Wendy Hiller ani Basfl
Rathbone, and ,turned It into m

bonanza,now Hollywood bound?...
Hasn'tJerry Lester, thecomic,,im-
proved 1,000 per centsince he lost
that belligerent delivery?... And
aren't the Copacabana managers
glad they didn't remain mad at
Jerry just becauseof a minor ia--
cident7

What everhappenedto theplan
to presentAl Jolson in concert se-
ries, a la Maurice Chevalier?...II
uisen and Johnson startled a few
British critics with their noisily un-
tidy material in a vaudeville show,
won't they just about blast th
English out of their teacups when
they present a full-sca- le produc-
tion of "Hellzapoppin" in a few
weeks?...Aren't the wise guys eat-
ing their tickets now-- that "Ut
With Father" has turned into a hit
In England after first reports that
the British were takln It a Htttf
diffidently?...Isn't it comforting t
oiosiers 10 see the D'Oyly Carte
Opera troupe setting aHorts of
fancy records at the Century The-
ater with their Gilbert and Sullivas
revivals?...Wouldn't Lucille Ball
ratherstayright hereon Broadway
and do a comedy; musical or
straight, rather than go back to
Hollywood and leave herhandsome
uesi:

Hasn't the Belmont-PIaz-a man-
agement at last got' smart in pre-
senting name acts such as Georgia
Price, and Isn't their cash register
emphasizing their judgment? . .

WORD-A-DA- Y

By MOCET BACH

TURBULENT
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LEGAL NOTICE

Hone
TO THE KXAI ASP TKPI OWKBtS.

rmimi HEREnwrxR namxd .or
CORR2CTLY KAUZ9 OR "HOT,-- OP.PBOP--
xxrr abutting upox uxcom
STREET AND SCXDBT OliLLH STREl'lo
AND AVENlitS WIlHlif THT LOOTS
HEREISAnnf OESCRISTD. 1H THE
CTTT OP BIO SPRWO. TEXAS, AOT TO
ALL OWNING OR CLAIMTTTO AXY SUCH
ABUTTDfG PROPERTY. OR ANY PtTEK-ES-T

THEREET. ASP TO ALL INTEREST-
ED ET AST OP THEPROCEEDWOB.
CONTRACTS OR OTHER MATTERS
HEREINAFTER Mi-- Si IUMU.

Notice U hereby firm to tbt roil
sod true oners, vhether btreinalter
Based or correctly nased or set. of
property abuttlst cscn Xineeln Street
and stasdry ether streets and atrnnts
vlthia tfct Ifcslts kereia denned la tht
City ef Bit Burin?. Texat and aO per-e- m

cyrirsr cr elaiTrrinr iy reels abot-tt-at

rreperty. er aay Interest therein.
and to an ethers elalmint er Interested
In any ef said property, or la any ef
the proceedings, contracts and matters
herein mentioned, that:

The aty Commission ef the City ef
Bis; Spring. Texas, by duly enacted or-
dinance dated March 23. 1948. u assend--e

er ordinance dated March 31. 1948.
has determined the necessity for. and
ordered the permanent trnprorement ef,
the foIloTinr streets and arecneswithin
the roUovlnr limits. In the City cf sic
Serine. Texas, to-v- it:

LINCOLN STREET, from the South
piuneiu Use ef Martha Street to the
Worth muutiU line of Wasnlnsten sot
leTard laeladinr Jefferson Street Inter--
secttea. tson and desisnated u cut
ItO. 19.

JEFFERSON STREET, from the iMt
Uroperty Use ef TirmTn Street to the
North y.uWj line of Washinrtoa Bon-lera- rd

Indsdlns Tlrrinia Arcane Inter-sectio- n,

knoxn and desimated aa Unitye. 20.
V1KU1N1A STREET, front the Strathp:cwu line ef Wsthinrtea Beulrrard

to the North property line ef ML View
street, kxern and desisnatedu Unit Mo.
2L

SOUTH JOHNSON STREET, from the
South iu.uvti.lj Une ef 18th Street to the
North v:uuc:U line of 20th Street

ISth Street intersection, kntrrn
and designated as Unit So. 3X

SOUTH MAIS STREET, from the South
jiroperty line cf 18th Street to the Ko-l- ifl

piuucjtj Une ef 20th Street lneltoK
'29th Street intersection, knom and dec:-aste-d

u Unit Wo. 23.
PARK STREET, from the East 'prop-

erty Une of Ytrcinta Street to the Worth
property line ef ML View Btrt. knovn
and desisnated-- as Unit No. 34.

WEST laTH STREET, from th West
Property tine ef Park hiil Dries to the
West property line ef Aylford Street

Docslaa and PeansrlranlaStreet
Intersections, known and desisnated as
Unit Wo. 23.

WEST 17TH STREET, from ths West
property line of Fennsylrania Street to
the West property line ef Arif 3rd Street.
fcagen and designated as. Unit So. 28.

SOUTH SOLAS STREET, from the
SantapivjtiU line ef 11th Place to the
Worth Diuueitj line ef 38th Street in-
cluding 12th. 13th. 14th. 16th. and 17th.
Btreet inter actions, knowa and deslg-gat-ed

as Unit Wo. 27.
FESKSTLTASIA STREET, from the

Wr
Fr.Ft

Unit For Tt
Impta. Prep.

Agst Pre. AtstPrep. City
Pre.

19 TJTtmra rrea SFL
of Martha to WFX.
ef Wash. Brd. 8U9 SXSI3C47 94.003647

30 Jeffersea St: from
EFL ef TJnmin to
KFL ef Wash. Blvd.

31 Virginia St: from
EPL of Wash. Bird,
to WPL ef 1R. View

22 8. Johnsea St frea
SPL ef 18th BL t
KFL ef 23th St....

33 S. Mala St: frea
SPL ef 18th St ts
WPL ef 20th St

34 Park Eb from EPL
ef Virginia to STL
ef Mt

35 W. lata St fres
WPL ef Parkhm Dr
to WPL ef Aylford..

28 W 17th St from
WPL ef Pennsyl-
vania to WPL ef
Aylford

37 S. Solan 8t frea
SPL ef Ilth PL ts
WPL ef 18th St....

30 PeaasylTasla St
SPL ef Dallas

to SPL-- ef alley .Sa.
ef Park St

36W.7thBt freaWPL
ef Lancaster to EFL
pi alley betwecaLan-
caster and Ben Sts.

4.50798

333744

139

139

139

3J7381

Totals.

wrV nertiffi nt tald and are--
hues hereinabove dserlbed aad desig
nated by Unit ceasutuiea a

and Independent Unit ef the
Improvement and shall be Improved and
tht tmproTtmenta constructed therein at
separate and Independent ana
cverr other Unit ef said streets and
avenues, aad the assessments to be
levied, for said improvements la each
Unit er ef said streets and

shall be altogether separate and
distinct aad independent ef and from
tht asseszmeats to be levied la every
ether ef said Units aad portions ef said

aar? avenues, and la and
levying said assessmentsaainst tht prop

abutting cpea ene ef said Units,
ao matter er circumstance ta connec-
tion with any ether ef said Units shall
be considered er have any effect cpea
the other, all as fuSy aad ts tht tame
extent u If separata proceedings and
contracts had been had aad executed
with reference to tht Improvements to
be made in each ef said Units.

A wQ be glvea aad held by
and before the City Commission ef tht
City ef Big Spring. Texas, ea the 14th
day ef April. 1948. at 7:30 p. m.
o'clock, la the City Commission Cham-
ber ef the City Han ef the City ef
Big Texas, to the real aad true
owners, whether named er eerrectly
named er not of all moptttj
abetting upon said streets aad avenues
wlthia the limits above defined, and to
all persons er claiming any such
abutting uiupeiu. er interest
and to an others owning, claiming er
interested la said abutting property, er

ef proceedings, er
matters and things herein mentioned or.
xaeiceat to improved eats er con
tract .herein described.

At said time and plact an such per-
sons, firms, corporations and estates.
and their agents and attorneys, shall
hare the right to appear aad to be
heard and effer testimony as to .the
said assessments, aad to the amount
thereof, proposed to be assessedagainst
said abutting and the real and
trot owner er owners thereof, the Uen
and charge of personal liability ts st-
eer payment ef said assessments, the
special benefits to accrue to each sueh
abutting preperty and the owner er own-
ers thereof by virtue ef said Improve-
ments. If aar. er concerning any error.
Invalidity, lr regularity er deficiency, la
any proceedings cr contract la refereaee
to said improvements, aad said pro-
posed assessments aad concerning any
stair matter er thing as ts which hear-ta-g

is a constitutional prerequisite, to the
ef said assessments,proceedings

and. Improvements and ea whleh they
are eatitled to a hearing under the
CbBsttstloa and laws ef the State efrexu and the proceedings of said City
Temmfssiea ef the City ef Big Spring.

Contractor:
Brown fc Root lac

Houston. Texas
Contract Date:

September 9. 1947

pteperty lint of Dallas Street to
the Worth property line of alley 8outh
ef East Park Street omitting East Park
Street intersection, known and desig-

nated m Unit Ho. 30.

WEST 7TH STREET, from the West
preperty Une ef LancMter Street to the
East property Une ef alley between Lan-
caster and Bell streets, known and desig-

nated m Unit No. 38
by raising, grading, fining, widening,
paring, reparlngor repairing same and by
constructing, reconstructing or realign-
ing concrete curbs gutters where
determined by the City Engi-
neer, and by constructing such drains
and ether incidentals and appurtenanees
thereto. M are deemed necessary and
adeeuat by the aty Engineer: said
paring to consist ef tht construction,
reconstruction andrepair of a one and
one-ha- lf (1 2) Inch aspnaltle concrete
surface course upon a six (8") com-
pacted eaUche base ef the materials,
type and width as prorlded for in the
Plans and Specifications therefor pre-
pared by the City Engineer, here
tofore approved and adopted by said
City Commission, all of said improve-
ments to be done In the manner and m
ortnided for In said Plans and Specifi
cations and the contract eoTering the
construction ef said Improvements, here
tofore awarded to Brown & Root. me.
by said City Commlsilon and which
contract is dated September 9. 1947.
whleh said Plans and Specifications and
contract are hereby referred to and are
ea file in tht office ef the City Secretary
and tht City Engineer ef the City of
21s Spring. Texas.

That said above mentioned ordinance
enacted w the City Commission en
March 33. 1948. ordered the Improvement
ef said above described streets within

limits above defined, and further
erded and directed that said improve-
ment '-- said streets be constructed
and built by said contractor. Brown 4s
Root. Ine-- under and in accordance
with tht terms, previsions and unit prices
ef raid contract dated September 9,
1947. referred to. and pursuant
to tht provisions of said contract there--
Tor.

That said City Commission caused
the City Engineer to prepare and fUt
tht hereinafter set out estimates ef the
costs ef roch Improvements and has
heretofore by duly enacted ordinance
dated March 31. 1948. determined the
necessity ef levying assessments for a

of tht costs of tht construction
ef said improvements against tht prop-
erty abutting upon said streets within
tht llraiu abort dtilned. and tht real
and true owners thtrtof. and did adopt
and determine tht hereinafter tit out
proposed apportionment ef tht costs ef
said improvements between said City
and tht said abutting preperty. and tht
real and true owners thereof, and that
tht portion ef said costs proposed to be
assessedagainst the said abutting prop
erty. and the real and true owners
thereof, win be in accordance with the
PROST-TOO- T RULE OR PLAN, and
did further adopt the following proposed
rates estimates of said costs in
reference to and for each of said streets
and avenues within the limits above
defined and In the following
schedule by tht Unit numbers of said
streets and avenues, to-w-it:

Anrt Total
Per Ajwt Anrt
Ft Far Fr.Ft Tttal Total

Ma. Sfcrwt Curb lar-- for Said Cost Cost
Gutter igAtst To

Owners
Owns. Owners

Owners
St:

View.

from

Uf Xe90t 4.009

139 218225 4J05IM

139 3.11TH

139 4.64744

381364 43T1M4

139 3.13607

139 3.374633 4.964633

3.73068 4.13068

3.614M

139 06381

streets

numbers
separate

rrea ea--n

portiea
aresues

streets making

erty

hearing

Sprint.

herein

owning
therein.

any the contracts

sate

vtcpetU.

ralldity

South

and
necessary

and

the

abort

hsi

portion

and

indicated

tPtr

Texas.

Total
--Cost

Impta.

S 6618,07 8 883.80 8 7501.87

8990.88 777.43 7767.98

4389.34 387.40 4678.74

8409.60 811.43 C331.03

5576.89 830.22 6397.11

4040.93 394.3 443834

11134.05 3713.03 13838.08

289S.40 867.60 3763.00

17306.69 8306.74 33613.43

3487.93 334.99 3732.93

1221.86 92.52 131438

86866130313388.48 881949.78

renewing such hearing, utestments
will be levied against each and every
parcel ef piepeitj abutting upon said
streets and avenues, within tht waits
abort defined, and tht real and true
owners thereof, for that portion ef the
costs ef said improvements determined
by said City Commission to be payable
by such abutting properties, and tht real
and true owners thereof, and said assess-
ments shaU bt and constitute a first and
prior Uea upon said abutting property,
frera the date said improvements were
ordered by said City Commission and
ahaU be a personal liability and charge
against the real and true owners thereof.
m ef said date, whether such property
be described er correctly described, or
sueh real and true owners be named.
er correctly named. In such proceedings
er net and ao error er mistake or dis-
crepancy la the names ef such owner
er owners or in describing said property
ta this notice or la any ef said pro-
ceedings with reference to said improv-
ement, shan invalidate any assessment
er certificate Issued in evldenet thereof.
but nevertheless each parcel ef property
abutting upon said streets, and tht rtal
and trot owner or owners thereof, shall
be charged with, and be liable for. said
assessmentwhleh shall bt vaud whether
er not sueh owner er owners bt named
er correctly named, or such property
bt described er correctly described, all
as provided for under the Acts ef tht
40th Legislature of the State ef Texas.
Pint Called Session. Chapter 106. com-
monly known as Article 1105--b. Revised
Civil Statutes ef Tcxm. m amended,
and heretofore adopted by said City
Commission m tht Acts under which
said improvements, proceedings and

art being constructed, per-
formed and levied.

Tht following ts a list ef tht aeeartnt
owners and descriptions ef said abutting
properties en said streets and avenues
within tht limits abovt defined, which
list aay be Included in any one er all
ef tht pubUeatlena of this notlet and Is
Included herein merely sa aa aid to
assist In giving notice to tht real and
true owners ef said abutting property,
and ts cumulative ef. and In addition
to, tht requisites of the foregoing noticeu prorlded for by said Acts, above
Identified, which notice in itself is valid
and suffleitnt and tht following list and
schedule than net be conclusive aa to
tht real and true owner er owners, and
the descriptions of said abutting aronertr.
nor shan said list limit this notlea to
sueh owners named er property de
scribed, but this said notice shall never-
theless bt directed to the real and true
owner er owners ef an of said abutting
property en said streets and avenues.
wlthia the limits defined above, whether
named er correctly aamed herein or
set

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 19

LZWCOLW STREET from the south preperty lint ef Martha street to tht north
preperty line ef Washington Boulevard Including Jefferson street Intersection.
known and designated as Unit Wo. 19.

Street Width:
30 ft curb ta curb

Assessment Rates:--
Curb aad gutter 139 per
front foot
Other improvements

per front foot
Ne. of Assmt Assmt

Names ef Property PROPERTY BBCRirnONFrtnt far Othtr Imp. Tttal
Owners Lot Blk. Addn. Fst Curb. Exc Curb, Assmt

Qutt Qutter
NORTH SIDE

2.613647

Pirst Baptist Church 10 6 Wash.PL 318.1 8300388564.81 8865.19
OUlt McDanlel 11 8 Wash.PL 242 33638 632.50 968.88
Ross H. Boykia 12 8 Wash.PL 60 83.40 156.83 240.22
J. L. LeBlea S 20 Wash.PL 10 194.60 365.91 560.81
BUI Bonner 30 Wash.PL 142 197.38 371.14 868.32

- SOUTH SIDE ,
"-

-s George R. French 27 6 Wuh.Pl. 66.9 92.99 174.83 267.84
. J. C. Waits 26 Wash. PL 60 83.40 156.83 340.32
V a. a. Morehead . 25 Wash.PL 60 83.40 156.83 340.22
f H. L. Bonaanoa - 24 Wash. PL 60 83.40 156.83 240.22
H Tom Rosaoa 23WH.ef23 Wash.PL 82.3 114.68 215.63 33031
J J. W. Davis 21 A ZH ef 23 Wash.PL 82.5 114.68 218.63 33031

HoUIa Webb 30 Jc Wi of 19 6 Wash.PL 82J 114.68 215.63 33031Harry D. Wetg. Est 18 b Ei ef 19 8 Wuh.PL 82J 114.68 213.63 33031
C L. Rowdea " 17 Wash.PL 148 205.72 386.82 592.54
Mrs. W. D. McDonald 16 6 Wuh.PL 128 177.93 334.55 513.47

Total Preperty Owaer'a Cost 3297.69 4320.38 6618.07

- City of Big Spring 883.80
Total Cast 2297.69 432038 7S0L87

AUIUMINT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 30

JEFFERSON BTREET. from tht east pr6perty Une of Lincoln street to tht north
property lint ef Washington boultvard Including Virginia arenut Intersection.
known and dtslgaattd as Unit No. 20.

Contractor:
Brown it Root Inc.

Houston. Texas
Contract Date:

September 9. 194T

Names of Prestrty
Owners

Ross H. Beykln
A. E.. Ashley
Dart Duncan
Jot Blum
C. E. Courtoa
Wayne Parish
Dick R Lane
Mrs. J. D. Bennett
C. O. Bledsoe
H. W. Wright
R. r. Lyons
J. W. Elrod

J. L. LtBltu
Mrs. Mary OlUuly
Earl J. Cooper
Angy Glenn
Ltenard A. Cokir
ButI Tox

Lonnle A. Coktr
Repps CJultar r

Property Owner's

City Spring
Cost

BTREET, property boultvard to
as

Contractor:
Brown, ft Root

Houston. Texas
Contract Date:

September 9.

ef
Property

Etoyle L. Martin
J. Robtrts
Clyde MeMahon
K. B. Compton
Helen

Brenner
Crenshaw

Crenshaw

T. L. Griffin
C. L. Rowe
Wayne K. Williams
W. K. Williams

Brown

Contractor:
Brown

September

Tsxu
SepUraber

Names

H.

let

R. Lee

Bettlt

M.

LEGAL NOTICE

Width:
30 ft to

and 1.31

No. of Astmt Assmt
Othtr

Let Ilk. Addn. Exc. Assmt
Qutttr

:j

8

18

Total

Total

Total

Texu

Street

NORTH
Wash

SIDE

Wash.
Wain.
Wash.
Wash.
Wash.
Wash.
Wash.

Wash.
Wash.
Wash.

20 Wash.
3 W of 3 30 Wash.
1 30' J 20 Wash.
4 W 20' of 3 Waih.

40' 'Of 3
W 40 3

1 ft 20' of 2
9
Cost

of Big

PI.

PI.
PI.

PL
PI.

.4
30'

PI.

120

140

Wath.Pl.
Waih.PL 193

135

Street Width:
curb

SIOE
Wash.

EAST SIDE

Wash.
Wash.
Wash.
Wain.

Waih.
Waih.

AssessmentRates:--
gutter per

front
Other Improvements
2.6909 front

FROFIRTY DESCRIPTIONFrent for Total
Curb.

166.80
83.40
83.40
83.40
83.40
83.40
90.35
77.84
76.45

194.60

161.45
322.91
161.45
161.45
161.45
161.45
161.45

150.69
148.00
376.73

344.65
489.71
244.85
244.85
244.85
244.85
244.85
263.26
228.53
224.43
37133

17931 347.13 836.44
83.40 161.45 244.83

123.10 342.18 367.28
125.10 242.18 367.28
111.20 315.37 326.47

111.20 215.37 336.47
368.27 819.34 787.61
187.65 363.27 330.93

238L07 6990.55

777.43

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO.

VTROrwiA frea tht south lint of Wuhtntton
tht north Unt ef Mt View street known and designated No. 31.

Int.

1947

Deals

Doilt

30 te

Assessment Rates:-Cur- b
gutter

front
Other improvements

front
Assmt Assmt.

Names of PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONFront Other Total
Owners Let Addn. Curb. Curb, Assmt

Qutt Qutttr

H.

M.
Mrs. L.

Odessa

Appltton
Property Owner's 1417.81 2871.53 4289.34

Bprlng
Cost

Brown

U

curb curb

ef

19
IS
17
18
18
14
I

WEST

17 18
ef 14

all 15 16
12 ft 13

all

PI.

11

8 PI.

PI.

PL
PL
PL
PL
PI.

PI.
Waih. PI.

Cum
foot.

Imp.
Feet

60

60

60
60
60
65
56

rt wain, fu 128
PL
PL

r PI.
4

X

Unit

curb

aU

11
11
11
11

11

eo

DV

90

4 80

4

ft

11

PI.
PI.
PI.

PI.
PI.

60

55

90

I

8 83.40

21

and per

per foot.
No.

for Imp.
Ilk. Feet Exc.

140
60 83.40 168.91 253.31
60 83.40 1RR.91 233.31
88 7A.4S 1S4.84 331.39
88 76,45 184.64 331.30
68 76.43 134.84 331.39
58 76.43 331.29

76.45 154.84 231.29

13 Waih. PI. 140 194.60 394.13 388.73
13 123 173.75 351.90 525.63
12 Wash.PI. 50 69.50 140.76 210.26

12 Waih. PI. 62.5 86.88 17S.95 363.83

BVi ef 14 12 Wash.PL 62.3 86.88 176.95 263 83
Otto V. 10 ft 11 12 Wash.PL 45 62.55 126.69 189.24

Total Cost

Oty of Big 38740
4676.74

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 22

SOUTH JOHNSON STREET, from the south property line of 18th street to the
north property of 20in street Including 19th street Intersection, known and
designated as No. 22

Contractor:
ft Root Inc.

Houston.
Contract

9. 1947

SIDE

N4

Unit

Btreet Width:
36 curb curb

139

line

Assessment Ratei:- -
and gutter 139 per

front foot
Other improvements

per front foot
No. ef Assmt Assmt

Namesef Property PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONFront for Other Imp. ToUl
Owners Let Blk. Addn, Feet Curb, Exc. Curb, Assmt

Qutt Qujtter
WEST SIDE

Olen Lewis 1 3 CoL Hts. 60 t 69.50 9325.40
J. B. Arnett 2 3 Col. Hts. 50 69.50 155.90 225.40

Stephens 3 3 Col. Hts. 50 69.50 155.90 225.40
8Ura J. XJoeiel 4 3 Col. Hts. 50 69.50 135.90 225.40
I B. Low "

S 3 Col Hts. 30 69.50 155.90 225.40
Ruby 3 Col Hts. 50 69.60 155.90 225.40
Clayton Coats N 50' or 22 Col. Hts. 50 69.50 155.90 225.40
J. W. Arnett M 50' Of NEV4 22 Col. HU. 50 69.50 155.90 225.40
Helen Allen Hendrlek 8 50' NE '.' 22 Col. Hts. 50 69.50 155.90 225.40
E. D. Stephen. Jr. 60' ef SEV 22 Col. HU. 50 69.80 155.90 225.40
Walter B. Jones M 80 of SE'.'t 22 Col. Hts. 80 89.80 155.90 223.40
Minnie Mat McGregor 8 50' ef SEVs 22 Col. Hts. SO 69.50 155.90 223.40

EAST
W. P. Toung 12 Ni ef 11 2 Col. Hts. 75 104.25 233.85 338.10
W. E. 10 8H of 11 2 Col. Hts. 75 104.25 233.85 338.10
M. L. Dlgby 9 3 Col. HU. 50 69.50 155.90 225.40

P. Petty, Jr. 8 2 CoL HU. 50 69.50 155.90 225.40
lee rfaU 7 2 CoL Hts. 50 69.80 155.90 225.40
Dora RoberU 80' ef Col. HU. 50 69.50 135.90 225.40
William A. Carter M 80' ef NWV 23 CoL HU. 80 69.50 155.90 325.40
Travis Omar 8 50 er NWtt 23 Col. HU. SO 69.50 165.90 225.40
R. E. Satterwhlta H 100 of 8Wy 23 COL Hts. 100 139.00 311.80 450.80
Herbert A. Moort 8 80' of 8W V4 33 CoL Hts. 80 155.90 235.40

Total Proptrty Owner's Cost 1668.00 3741.60 5409.60'

City ef Big Spring 81143
Total , 1668.00 3741.60 6221.03

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 23

SOUTH MAIN BTREET. from tht south Une of 18th street to tht north
Unt of 20th stmt Including 19th street Intersection, known and desig-

nated No. 23.

ft Root Inc.
Houston. TtxM

Contract Date;
9. 1947

Carl

Curb.
Qutt

ft

ft

E

.1

ft
ft

ft
ft

zo

ft

Wuh.PL

property

N

SIDE
ft
ft

8.

R

as

Street Width:
curb to curb

2.8132254

6388.73

WMh.Pl.

1417.81

8344.83

8194.60

8155.90

Harper

property
proptrty

Assessment
gutter 139 per

front foot
Other improvements
3.35744 per foot

No. ef Assmt Assmt
Namesef Property PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONFront for Other Imp. ToUl

Owntra Let Blk. Addn, Feet Curb, Exc. Curb, Assmt
Qutt Qutttr

WEST SIDE
J. W. Elrod 1 ft 3 S Col. HU. 100 9139.00 8335.74 8464.74
H. B. Mills 3 5 Col. HU SO 69.50 162.87 233.37
W. O. Mlms 4 8 CoL HU SO 69.50 163.87 232.37
Wayland D. Oreea 8 5 CoL HU 80 69.50 162.87 232.37
W. C. Henley 6 5 Col. Hts SO 69.50 162.87 23237
B. W. Boyd N 200' of E'i 20 CoL HU. 200 278.00 651.49 929.49
O. J. M 50' ef SEV 20 Col. HU. SO 69.50 162.87 232.37
Haiel Griffith 8 50 Of SB '.' 20 Col. Hts. 50 69.50 232.37

SIDE

B. P. Lovelace 13 N 35'
ef 11 4 Col. HU. 88 118.15 376.88 395.03

J. W. Elrod W 43' el 10
8 13' of 11 4 CoL HU. 58 80.62 269.55

AUen R. Hamilton 9 ft 8 7' ol 10 4 Col. Hts. 57 79.23 183.67 264.90
Luelan A. Jones 8 4 CoL Hts. 80 69.30 162.87 232.37
J. H. Jennings 7 4 COL HU. SO 69.80 162.87 232.37
T. B. Atkins N 80' Of NWV 31 Col. HU. SO 69.50 162.87 232.37
Ben O. Hartley M 50' el NWV 21 Col. HU. SO 69.50 162.87 233.37
James E. Settles 8 80' ef NW 31 Col. HU. 50 69.50 162.87 232.37

E. Moore W 50' of SWV 31 CoL HU. SO 69.50 162.87 233.37
R. E. Blount 8 100' of SWU 21 CoL HU. 100 139.00 333.74 464.74

Total Property Owner's Cost 1668.00 3908.89 3876.89

City ef Big Bprlng . ' 82032
1668.00 3908.89 6876.98

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 34

PARK BTREET. frem tht tut property line of Virginia street to the north prep-
erty line of Mt VIiw strut known and designated u No. 24.

Contractor:
ft Root Int.

Houston.
Contract Datt:

9. 1847

ef Proptrty
Owntra

C. L. Rowt
C. L. Rowt

Gross

Robert B.

E.

Clayton N.

W. K..WUllam
Andre Areand
Hannah Welnkauf
Stanley L. Bogard
R. Thompson

SOUTH

Wash.

cf

ft

36 ft

Btreet Width:
30 ft curb to curb

NORTH'

WMh.PL

SOUTH

foot

8161.43

4609.48

231107 4609.48 7767.98

foot.

9394.13

3.11796

Harris

Carlton

Hates:-Cur- b

front

MeMasters

EAST

Celt

Unit
Assessment rutei
Curb and gutter, 139
front
Other ImprovemenU
2.881864 front loot

No. ef Aismt Assmt
PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONFront for Othtr Imp. ToUl

Ltt Blk. Addn. Feet Curb, Exe. Curb. Assmt
Qutt Cutter

SIDE
9 ft 10
11 ft 13

N 8' ef 31 ft
33 ft 33

N 17' ef 29 ft
30 ft 8 17'
of 31

37 ft 28 ft B 8'
ef 29

N33 ft 26

4

11

to

6

of

13 8166.80 8345.79 8813.89
13 Wash. 120

13 Waih. PL 69

Waih.

per

83.40

174.91

184.84

.1.83

Curb

Bert

NEV

NWV

69.50.

COlt

Unit

162.87

188.93

AlrU

Total

per
foot

per

Wash.PI. 130
PL 166.80 345.79 513.59

83.01 170.01 333.03

13 Waih. PI. 89 83.01 170.01 283.03

13
13 PL

SIDE

ft

ft

'

'

88
45

80

85

23

80.62 167.13 347.75
62.55 129.67 192.23

18 12 Waih. PL 132.8 184.18 381.81 565.99
1 ft 3 ' 12 Wash.PL 183.8 2S3.68 825.89 779.87
3 ft 4 12 Waih. PI SO 69.50 144.08 213.58
S ft 13 Waih. PL . 50 69.50 144.08 313.88

7, 8, ft 9 12 Waih. PL 70 97.30 301.71 399.01

Total Property Owner's Cost 1314.93 2723.97 4040.92

aty ef Big Spring 394.33

Total Cost..' 1314.95 3725.97 4438.34

Ask The People

Who Use Them!

HERALD

CLASSIFIEDS

GET RESULTS!

LEGAL NOTICE

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 3S

WEST 18TH STREET, from tht weit property lint of Parkhlll Drive to the west
proptrty lint ef Aylford strstt Including DoueUs and Pennrjlvanla street Inter--

iietloni. known and diilrnttid as Unit No. 23.

Contractor:
Brown ft Root. Ine.

Houston. Tsxm
Contract Date:

September 9. 1947

1.39

No. of Assmt
Namtt of Proptrty PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONFront for Other Imp.

Owners' Ltt Blk. Addn. Feet Curb. Fxe. Curb.
Qutt

Urn MeCt'Ueueh
William r Cushlng
Lewis H. Prlet
Pdward B. Munihy
Q. V. lbkowiky

Stripling
Worth Peel"
Pvertt L. Ellis
O. w. ni Aima Piner
H O. Agee
Mill R Wood
Hi'dren I'niWs
Julia MrClkey
Olbori v. Psrrs-Do- ra

Rohnrts
Ray S.

H r "Hon
V, T Wrlertewald
C. .T. Staples
H W. Whirner
J Doyl Wilson
Albert Smith
Merrill Rayier
J. E Burnt
Vernon n. Smith
Frank J.
Minnie Howre
Walter L. Phillips
C. T. Cllnkeesles
TMwartf v. gwift
Howrd H. Stephens
K. H. Stephens
Ralph Wvatf
Monroe Of'ford
D. T. Cook
B. 8. Shrere

Total Property. Owner's Cost

he

Contractor:
ft

Hojuton.
Contract

September 9.

nwCRIPTIONPrmt
Owntra

Bonner
Kllllnrsworth
L Z.

anrt
vrillinssworth

A. Bonner

Killlnriworth

City

Pnot Ine.

1947

and

Beck

and

W. Bonner
A. J. MeCllnton

Bonner
Killlnriworth

U. D.

of BI

A.

B.

Prbcertv Cost

City ef
Cost

Contractor:
Ine.

September 9. 1947

9,

Mrs.

S. True

8.
L.

Spring

Total Cost.

Brnwn
Tests

Total

Owntr" Colt

coit

Cost

31st March.

(BEAU

Street Width:
36 ft. curb to curb

Assessment Rates'-Cur- b
gutter per

front foot.
Improvements

3.13607 per foot
Amt.

ToUl
Assmt

Gutter

Robert

Parker

Duley

NORTH SIDE
n s Park vn.B tw s sn
7 .1 Park Hill 60 1RS.16 271 J
6 8 Park Hill 60 810 1A8 1 37t3fi
8 ParkH"! 0 1RR.1R 571

4 .1 Park win w .l.4n mU r?n
5 8 ParkHIU 6n (i.n 1PB16 2716
J R vtrkHl'l 60 Rin irp ir rn t
1 - S ParkHIU 60 Rtsn irr i ?7i.
. g a Psrvwi 1"o ift7n wii'
t a prk vrin an R3.en irh'ir w
2 R Park will o so ipa 1

1 R ParkH'll Rt.40 1RR.1R 271,R
s ? WMtniff l?n lRfipn T7fi.vi tain

j" a West flier an stsn 1RR.1R 271.M
5 2 vrestni" n R-

- o ipa ia ,971 r
1 2 West Cliff 60 83 40 188.16 271 S6

SOUTH SID

10 ? "arV nil! 70 0710 oiov iirpi
a ? ParkHi'l 70 07 7O T10 52 t1R.7
8 7 Park M en.t.a 7W.R4 904 10

7 7 HIM 6 o 35 201 PS o 10
R T RO R1.40 1BR.1R 7.71 .1

n. 2 ParkHIU o sn 40 ipr.ir w
4 ? ParkHIU 60 11R 271

5 9 ParkHin Ro P740 us ia nt fi

2 5 ParkHIU RO R140 1P.1R 271.5R
1 2 ParkHIU RO m 1R 771

8 1 Park HI'! 70 Q7in ?loft7 imp?
4 1 ParkHI'l 60 R3.40 1RR 1R 271.56
1 1 ParkHHI 60 Ri 40 irb ir 771

3 1 ParkH"! o Rl.sn 1R.1 ?7t ft

1 1 Prk Hi" ao Ri n 1 " "

8 1 ,"etCliff 10 41 7n 04.0R 17ft 7P

4 J vortnif an m n ip in 7i
7 1 miff ao RTiO-IBPI- i'i"
3 1 Wet Cliff RO 111.90 9V1.R0 7R9(in
1 1 Wet Cliff RO 111.20 23n.RH 362.00

as:.! 7707.71 11120

3416.34 71 13836.08

t$MeMT wnLLS
UNIT NO. J

WEST 17TH 8 ' Ilk'.'). fom ornnrtr "n of pnnri rrt n the
property line of Alyford itrt. known and desisnated Tinll No. 36.

Date:

Campbell

Street
to curb

Pates'-fiir- h
eutter 1 39 per

imorovments
7.57463.1 n- - front

No. of Astmt. Assmt.
Nam nf Preperty PROPERTY fur otSer'-nn-. Total

Ltt Blk. Addn. Fttt C"rh. rr. Curb. Assmt
Gutt Qutter

Bonner

W.
Bonner

Prank
snd

Owner's

Big Bering
ToUl

front

83.41

w,i

NORTH SIDE,

8 3 Went Cff RO I 914.i 9is
4 3 WestCliff 60 83.40 214.4R 297.88

3 3 WestCliff RO R7.40 911 4R 9P7
5 3 WestCliff 60 83.40 214.48 297.88

1 ., 3 Went Cliff 60 83.40 214.48 297.88

SOUTH SIDE

7 2 West Clif 190 1R0 49RSB ftq?
8 2 WestCliff RO ft.1.40 914 .R
9 2 WestCliff 60 83 40 214.48 297.88

10

It.

2 WeSPCllff 60 37 40 914 4R 217.PR

780 RO 2144 9ROS 4Q

8R7.R0

ASSMEMT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 2T ,

SOUTH NOLAN STREET, from the louth nrorirr 1ln of 11th P'c n tr
property of 18th street Including 12th. 13th 14th. 16th. and 17th street in-

tersections, known and desisnated as Unit No. 27.

Brown & Root
Houston. Texas

Contract Date:

Btreet Width:
30 ft curb to curb

Assessment Rates-Cur- b
and gutter per

front foot
Other improvements
2.73068 per

No. of Assmt. Assmt.
Names ef Property PROPRTY DESCRIPTIONFront for Othtr Imp. Total

Owntra Let Blk. Feet Curb. Curb. Assmt
Qutt Cutter

WEST SIDE
H. Beden 1 ft 2 26C P"vw His. so t 6f in 57 jnR.m
R. V. Poresyth 34 26C Tvw Hts. SO fiJ.ftn lift 206.07
R. V. Poresvth 56 26C P"vw Hts. 50 fii.ftn lift S7 9.ofi ai
V. O. Powell 1 & 2 2BD P'vw 50 R9.50 176.57 90S 0.7

Currle C. Klneanon 3 & 4 2RD P"vw Hts. 50 69 1.76.5.7 206 03
C. R. Dunlgan 56 26D P'vw Hts. 50 69.50 136.53 20R 03
W. M. Gage 2. 3. 4 Pvw Hts. 100 139 273.07 412.07
H. aay Read. 8 & 6 23C F"vw Hts. 69.50 136.53 206.0.7
H. aay Read. Est 1 ft 2 23D Hts. SO 69.50 136.53 206.03
Brandon Curry 3 ft 4 23D Pvw Hts. 50 69.30 136.5.7 206.03
W. O. Pederson 8 ft S 23D Pvw Hts. 50 69.50 136.53 206.03
Curtis Revnolds 1 ft 2 18C Pvw Hts. 50 69.50 136.53 206.03
Howard Sallaburr 3 ft 4 18C TVW Hts. 50 69.30 136.53 206.03
Clyde Thomas. Sr. 5 ft 6 FVW 50 69.50 176.57 206 07
Qeorgt Tilllnghait 1 ft 2 18D Tvw Hts. SO 69.50 136.53 206.03
A. B. Mains 3 ft 4 18D Fvw Hts. 50 69.50 136.53 206.03
Cecil A. Norton 5 ft 6 18D Pvw Hts. 69.50 136.33 206.03
William W. Sewtll 1 ft 2 15C rvw Hts. 50 69.30 1.76.37 ?06.03
J. B. Terry 3 ft 4 ISC Fvw Hts. 50 69.50 136.33 206.03
W. Miller 8 ft 6 15C P"vw HU. 50 69.50 136.53 206.03
Colquitt ntXKtrtlS 1 ft 2 15D Fvw Hts. 30 69.50 136.53 206.03
Mrs. 1. A. Eubanks 3 ft 4 15D Pvw Hts. 50 69.50 136.53 206.03
Mrs. Lucille Merrick 8 ft 6 15D rvw Hts. 50 69.50 136.51 206.03
M. Boone Home 1 ft 2 IOC rvw Hts. 50 69.50 136.33 206.03
B. P. Petty 3 ft 4 IOC P"vw 30 69.30 138.57 206.03
O. R. Bollinger 8 ft 6 10C T'vw Hts 50 69.50 136.33 206.03
W. S. Satterwhlta 1 ft 2 10D Fvw Hte. SO 69.50 136.S3 206.03
Horace C. Beent 3 ft 4 10D rvw Hts. SO 69.50 136.57 206.03
Prank H. Staegy 8 ft 6 10D P'vw Hts. 50 69.50 136.33 206.07
A. B. SIsion 1. 2. ft 3 7C rvw Hts. 75 104.25 204.80 309.03
J. M. Lant ' 4. 5. ft 7C rvw Hts 75 104.23 204.60 709.03
H. aay Rtad. Elt 1 ft 2 7D rvw Hts. 69.50 15.33 20P.O7
J E. Kennedy 3. 4. 8. ft 6 7D rvw 100 139.00 27.7.07 412 07
H. aay Read.. Est 1 to 6. inel. 2C rvw Hts. 150 208.5O 409.60 618.10
H. aay Read. 1 to 6, inel. 3D rvw Hti. ISO 208.50 409.60 618.10

BAST SIDE

R. flay Read. Elt. 1 to 9. Inel. rvw Hts. 130 208.50 409.60 618.10
H. CTay Read. 1 6. Inel. 23A rvw 150 208 50 409.50 618.10
H. aay Rtad. Est 1 8. inel. rvw Hts. 150 208.50 409.60 168.10
H. aay Read. Est. 1 to 6. Inel. 24A rvw 150 208.30 409.60 618.10
C. R. Thompson 8 ft 6 17B P'vw HU. 69.50 206.03
T. A. Thlgpen 3 ft 4 17B rvw HU. 50 69.50 1.76.53 206.03
Jaek Read 1 ft 3 17B HU. 50 69 50 136.51 206.03
R. aay Read. Est. 1 to 6. Inel. 17A rvw HU. 150 203.30 409.60 618,10
Earl Brownrlgg 3ft 6 16B . P'vw Hts. 50 69.50 136.53 206 03
H. Oay Read. Elt 3 ft 4 16B rvw Hts. 30 69.50 138.33 206.07
Hall N. Scherer 1 ft 3 16B rvw HU. SO 69.50 136.33 206.03
H. aay Read. t to 8. Inel. 16A rvw HU. ISO 208.50 409.60 618.10
H. aay Read. 1 to 6. inel. 9B rvw HU. ISO 208 50 409.60 618.10
H. aay Read. Elt. 1 to 6. Inel. 0A rvw HU. 150 208.50 409.60 61R 10
H. aay Read. 1 to 6. Inel. 8R rvw ISO 208 50 409.60 61R 10
H. Oay Read. Elt. 1 to 6. Inel. 8A rvw Hts. 130 20B.S0 407.60 618.10
R. aay Read. 1 to 6. Inel. IB P'vw Hts. 150 208 30 403.60 618.10
H. Pay Read. Est 1 to 8. lnd. IA P'vw Hts. 130 208.30 409.60 618.10

Total Property Owner's Cost 3838.00 11468 69 17306.69

aty ef Big Spring 530"bV74

Total Colt 8838.00 11468.69 22613.43

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 30

PENNSYLVANIA BTREET. from the south property line of Dallas street to the
north preperty of alley south of East Park street omitting East Park street
intersection, known designated as No. 30.

Contractor:
Brown ft Root

Houston. Ttxai
Contraet Datt:

September 1947

curb eurb

ef Assmt Assmt
Namtt ef Preperty Imp.

Let Blk. Addn. Exc. Curb. Assmt
Qutt Qutter

Troy Olfford
J. W.
O.

C. Cempten
T. Currle
Warner Thomas

Proptrty

aty Big Spring
Total

ft
Texas

1947

O. B.

of

or Bis

$27.u

curb

Street

WEST SIDE
1 9 Hts. 156

12 9 Hts.
1 Edw. Hts. ISO

18
19
10

171

60

ft to

13

EAST SIDE

10 Ed
10 Edw.
12 Edw. 14fr

30 ft

and

Other

mn

"HI

9717 m

wtwest

"rt
fnt

nth- -

RO

RO

2144 3767

north
line

1.39

Hts.

2.7C 00
Est. SO

1BC Hts.

SO

D.

Hts.

30
Hts.

Est

23B
Elt. Hts.

24B
Hts.

50

Est.
Elt
Elt HU.

Est.

lint
and

Int.
Rales:-Cur- b

and 1.39 per
front foot.
Other Improvements

per front
No.

PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONFront for Other ToUl
Owntra Ftet Curb,

Elrod

John

Total

Edw
1SI

foot.

snfi

Unit

Hts. 140
HU. 140

750

8208.50 1392.18 8600.68

J60.63

1210.69

1210.69 2277.24 3722.92

ASSESSMENT ROLLS
UNIT NO. 36

WEST 7TH BTREET. from tht property line of Laneaiter to the eait
property line of alley between Laneaiter and Bell streeU. known and desimated
as Unit No. 36.

Contractor:
Brown Root Int.

Houston,
Contract Date:

September t,

Hull

M.40

jo7o

Park

P"vw

rvw

Edw.

Street
eurb to curb

7707

AniMimenl

60 80 00

foot

xe.

5.7

50

1

to
to

Asiessment
gutter

foot.

208.30 392.18 600.68

194.60 360.63

194.60 366.03 560.63

234.99

weit itreet

Assessment Rates:-Cur- b

and gutter 1.39 per
front
Other ImprovemenU

per root.

No. of Assmt Assmt
Names Preperty PROPERTY DESCRIPTIONFront for Imp. ToUl

Owner Ltt Slk. Addn. Fttt Exc. Curb, Assmt .

Qutt Qutter

NORTH SIDE
Cress

ToUl Proptrty Qwntr's Cost

aty Spring
Total

ParkHMl

Width:

2.61431

209.89 394.79

366.03
194.60 366.03

2277.24 3487.93

root

2.97381

8 41 Original 140 3194.60 8416.33 (610.83

SOUTH

1 Original 140 6194.60 6416.33 6610.93

1221.86

92.52

389.20 832.66 1314.38

Of aU said matters and thlngi. all owning or claiming any men abutting
proptrty or any Interest thtreln. at well as all others in anywise interested or
affected by tht things matters herein mentioned, will take notice.

DONE by order ef the aty Commlsilon of the City of Big Bprlng. Texai.

this tht day ef 1048.

907.RP

HU.

front

Addn.

136.37

604.68

rront

Other
Curb,

SIDE

67

and

C. R. UcCUENNY. City Secretary.
City ol Bis Sprint. Texas
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SUNDAY SCHOOL LESSON

NeedFor 'New Heart'
By NEWMAN CAMPBELL

Scripture EzeWel 18; 34; 36:22-3-8;

37:1-1- 4.

Ezekiel's prophecies were writ-

ten, it is thought, between595 and
585 B. C, when he, his people and
the king, Jeholachin, were exiled
from Babylon. All the people were
homesick and discouraged. They
needed cheering (even as we of
today), but they also should look
clearly at the facts and see where
at least part of the blamefor their
condition lay, so though Ezekicl.

Ezckiel evidently did not believe
in vicarious righteousness, and
placed his emphasis on personal
responsibility. He told his people
plainly that they needed a new
heart." That phrase has a familiar
ring After the dropping of the
atomic bomb. Winston Churchill is
reported to have said that "man
must havea new heart," and a well-know- n

American to have remarked
that the world's thinking must un-

dergo a "cleansing and reforma-
tion" if we would survive.

Like all the Old Testamentproph-
ets. Ezekiel repeated to his people
only what the Lord told him. God
came to him, he said, and asked
what the children of Isral meant
by the' saving that "The fathers
have eaten sour grapes and the
children's teethare set on edge?"
AU souls arc mine, the Lord saith,
"as the soul of the father, so also
the soul of the son is mine: the
soul that sinncth, it shall die."

If a man were just, doing that
which was right and lawful, he
would live, but he who oppressed
the poor and needy, used violence
in his dealings with his fellow-ma- n,

was a robber, a shedder of
blood, etc., would surely die. No
one, not even his father, was re-
sponsiblefor his wickedness.

"The son shall not bear the in-

iquity of the father, neither shall
the father bearthe iniquity of the
son; the. righteousnessof the right-
eous shall be upon him. and the
wickednessof the wicked shall be
upon him." However, if the wicked
turned from his sins, he would be
forgiven, it was promised.

That too, is a message for us.
We should not blame all the confu
sion and tragedy in the world on
those who have gone before us, or
on the wickedness of others. We
should search our own heartsand
see what we have done to help
bring about these conditions. Are
we broadminded?Do we look upon
every man as our brother, and
treat him as such? We hear many
complainst of workers who demand
large wages, but loaf on the job,
with no senseof responsibility to
ward their employers. There are
employers, too, who pile up huge
profits, but who shirk their' respon
sibilities to their fellow beings. We
too, need "a new heart." Acknow-
ledging these faults, we can do
somethingabout them, and win for
giveness through reformation.
These are errors that parents and
teachers should emphasizein their
guidanceof children.

The Lord also called Ezekiel's at
tention to the conductof the priests,
the shepherdsof the exiled Israel-
ites. They waxed fat and clothed
themselves in fine raiment. He
complained, while those they were
supposed to guide and comfort
were neglected. The "sheep"were
scattered, the prey of wild beasts,
while the shepherds feasted and
lived in luxury.

That accusation too, we of the
present generation may well take
to heart. Many today are feasting
and reveling while millions starve.
Thank God many more are aware
of the sufferings of others and shar--in-g

generously with those in need,
even at considerablepersonal sac-
rifice.

The Jews still are scattered over
the'face of the earth, and thosewho
are in exile in lands where they
have lost all their possessionsand
are truly "displaced persons," are
homesick and heartsick, longing
for homes and security. Ezekiel
promised his exiles that God would
take care of them, bring them to-
gether in their own land, where He
would help them to make the land
to blossom and bear fruit like the
Garden of Eden. !

The closing verses of our lesson
today tell the parable of the valley
of dry bones to which the Lord'
transported Ezekiel. As Ezekicl
"prophesied" over them, the bones
were assembled Into human skele--!
tons, the skeletons were clothed

A

April 22 & 23

9 a. m. to 9 p. m.

with flesh, muscle, skin, etc.. and
the breath of life was blown into
them by the four winds of heaven.

When this latter was accom-
plished, there was a "great army
symbolizing the restoration of a.
great nation.

We of today are not looking for-
ward to a reat army or a great
nation. We want a great world of
brotherhood and justice, and that
is the ideal to vhich we are workv
ing, with God's help.

MEMORY VERSE
"They shaU know that I. Jehovah
their God, aswith them." Ezekiel
34:30.

This name assures
quality. World's
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Local Long Distance

9555
New Trucks - Experiencetl

DriTers
"We Move Yon"
CALL 9555

Jack
Haynes

1005 Wood
Pb. 1477--J

ICE
BEER

Picnic Supplies
Ice Cold Pepsi-Col-a

$1.00 CaseEx.

WAYNE STIDHAM

Ice Station
1801 S. Gregg

NEW CROP
PUNTING SEED

Sweet
(Becleaned)

Regular Sodas
(Bedeaned)

Early Hegaxi
(Arizona CertifietD
Early Hegari
(Texas Certified)
Regular Hegari
(Arizona
Red Top Caaa

(Redeaned) "

Black HaH Kaffir
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White Cora
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Yellow Com
(Redeaned)

Texas MBo (Gooseseck)
(Redeaned)
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(Texas Certified)
Martin Milo
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"Plalnsmaa Milo

(Texas
Caprock Milo
(Texas Certified)
PlainsmanMilo
(Texas Redeaned)

Cotton Seed
Stora-pree- l)

Black-ey-e Peas

TUCKER

GRAIN ELEVATOR
Jc

BIc Spriar
Phone 1354

TRUMAN JONES
MOTOR COMPANY

ExtendsTo The Public

ST.JaSEPl

EarytoglT

CALL

-I- CE -I- CE

SsdsU

Certified)

Certified)

(Delinted

cordial invitation to attenda special "OpenHouse"
'celebration ,

and ,

The presentation of the "all new" 1949 Lincoln and

Lincoln Cosmopolitan

at your

Lincoln - Mecury Headquarters

.

403 Runnels

Big Spring, Texas

Refreshments

Entertainment
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2. Meui thread
t. Acquire

knowledge
4: Seat of

government
5. Encourage
6. And not
7. Malign
S. Common

Informer
I. Whistle with

varying pitch
10. Algerian

seaport
11. Desire
19. Cut down
21. Government

impost
24. Insect
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27. Craiy
IS. Divide
29. Actual
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35. Therefore
37. Growing out
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46. Measureof

length
43. Coincide
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50. Sky-bl- ue

EL Mediterranean
sailing vessel

53. Obtains
55. God of love
8. Literary bits

Aids in relief of asthma, sinus,hay fever, coughsand
colds.

Shampooscarpets and upholstery, mops floors, un-

stops local drains, waxesfloors, paints, cleanshomeof
all dustand dirt.

Many otheruses. This is the only machinethat uses
waterfor purification and dusttrap. This is the only
machine that can removedust from the air.

Call for Free Demonstration

or contactthe Rex-A-ir Dealer
in this territory.

This Machine is Not Sold in any Stores.

D. N. HULL 403 SettlesHotel

ANDERSON MUSIC CO.

113 Main

EXPERT RADIO REPAIRING
ALL MAKES

COMPLETE ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

Baseball Softball

Herald Radio Log
TheseSchedule ire by the Kadla

which are responsible for their icearaer. -

WhereTo Tune In: KBST, ABC-TS-N. 1490 KC; WBAP-WFA- J,

NBC," 820 KC: KRLD, CBS, 1080 KC.

6:00
KB8T-N- w

KELD-Btul- ah

WBAP-Bupp- er Club
6:15

KBST-Elm-er Davis
ERLD-Jae- k Smith Shew

6:30
KB3T-Lon- e Ranser
KRLD-Clu- b IS
WTAA-Sm- llt Prosraa

6:45
KBST-Lo- nt Rsnrer
KRLD-Z- d. Uurrow
WTAA-Ne-

7:00
KBST-Ne-

KRLD-Bs- Snooks
WTAA-Hwt- i. la Melody

7.0S
KB3T-8por-U

7:10
KB3T-- Ti Hews

7:15
KBST-Melo- Fsrsde
KRLD-Bs- br Snooks
WTAA-Hwt- i. In Melody

730
KBST-To- ur FBI
KRLD-Dsnn- y Thomn
WTAA-Cs- n Tou Top This

6:00
KBST-Sll- m Bryant
KRLD-Tez- as Roundup
WBAP-Bunkhou-se Bluet

:1S
KBST-Sll- m Brrant
KRLD-new-s
WBAP-Ne-

630
Shew

KRLD-A&- rarm Review
WBAP-Par- m Editor

6:43
Show

KRLD-A&- M Farm Review
WBAP-Far- m Mssszlne

7:00
KBST-Mutic- al CSoek
KRLD-New-s
WPAA-Ni-

7:13
KBST-Mutic- al Clock
KRLD-Son- ss of the Saddle
WFAA-Xarl- y Birds

730
KBST-Me-

KRLD-Ne-

WFAA-Zarl- y Birds
7.43

KBST-So- n of Pioneers
KRLD-Te- z Rltter
WFAA-Zarl- T Birds

13:00
KBST-Rldl-n' The Rente
KRLD-U.- S. Navy Band
WTAA-irew- s

13:13
KBST-Bl-nt Slnis
KRLD-Ne-

WFAA-Vlnce- nt Lopes

1230
KBST-Na-

KRLD-Coun- ty fair
WBAP-What- 's News

13:43
Serenade

KRLD-Coun- ty Fair
WBAP-Nat- 'l Farm Borne

1:00
KBST-Fsselnatl- Rhythm
KRLD-Olv- e and Take
WBAP-Nat- 'l Farm Jk Borne

1:13
Rhythm

KRLD-Olv- e and Take
WBAP-N-at Branywynne

130
KBST-Hltchl- Pott
KRLD-Oran- a Centra
WBAP-Salu-te to Veterans

l:s
KBST-Hltchl- Post
KRLD-Qran- d Central
WBAP-Salu-te to Veterans

SINCE 1927

STOCK

Tennis Golf

furnishes fttslleas,

WBAP-Strens-

FRIDAY EVENING
7:43

KBST-To- nr 731
KRLD-Dtnn- y Ttomss
W7AA-Ca- n Toa Top This

8.-0-0
"

KBST-aTmpho-nr ef Melody

WTAA-Ptop- le Are runny
8:13

KBST-Sympho- of Melody

WFAA-Peop- le Are Funny

KB3T-Mui- lo of Manhattan
KRLD-Ozzl-e & Harriet
WPAA-Wal-U Ttae

8:43
KSST-Moi- le of MsnhsUaa
KRLD-Oxi- le it Hsrrttt
WTAA-Wal- U Time

9.00
KBST-Here-'s To Veterans
KRLD'Dtnab Shore
W7AA-Myste- ry Theatre

9:15
KBST-dne- it Star
KRLD-Dina- h Shore
WFAA-Uyite- ry Theatre

930
KB3T-Onf- jt Star
KRLD-Spotlit- ht Rerne
WrAA-B- Stern

SATURDAY MORNING
8:00

KBST-Shopp- Bpfelal
KRLD-Kew-s
WPAA-Kew- s

8:18
KBST-Shoppe-rt Special
KRLD-Paru-ua Bandstand
WPAA-Ne-

830
KBST-Shopp- Special
KRLD-Sl-d BardU
WBAP-Morni- Roundup

8:43
KBST-Shoppe- r't Special
KRLD-Method- lit Hour
WBAF-Monu- ns Roundup

9.-0-

KBST-Yo- ur Home BeautlXul
KRLD-aarde- n Oat

WBAP-Momt- Roundup
9:13

KBST-Strlnsl- Aloes
KRLD-Waininst- wives
WBAP-Heal- Talk

9JO
KBST-Bo- y Scouts
KRLD-Ma- rr Lee Taylor
WBAF-Arcn-le Andrews

9:43
KBST-Th- ls Is For Tou
KRLD-Mar- y Lee Taylor
WBAP-Areh- le Andrews

SATURDAY AFTERNOON
2:00

KBST-Pian-o Playhouse
KRLD-Radl-o Revival
WBAP-Orch- s. of Nations

1:13
KBST-Plan-o Playhouse
KRLD-Radi-o Revival
WBAP-Orch-s. of Nations

330
KBST-AB- C Symphony
KRLD-Cro- tt Section
WBAP-Orch- s. of Nations

3.43
KBST-AB- C Symphony
KRLD-Cro- ts Section
WBAP-Orch-s. of Nations

3:00
KBST-AB- C Symphony
KRLD-Acce- nt on Youth
WBAP-Docto- rt Today

3:13
KBST-AB- C Symphony
KRLD-Acce- nt On Youth
WFAA-Doeto- rs Today

330
KBST-Spor-ts In Review
KRLD-Uk- e aMighty Army
WFAA-Muixs-

3:43
KBST-8por-ts In Review
KRLD-Llk- e a Mlcbty Army

WFAA-Uunea- sa

PhoBe S56

9:43
KBST-an-at Star
KRLD-8potll- ht Rerue--
WTAA-To- ur life At Stake

10.-0-0

KBST-Ne- rs

KRLD-Nn- ri
WBAP-Jfe-

10-1- 9

KBST-Meaor- y Las
iavu3-an-a star
WBAP-Ne-

K3ST-Oe- for Tbeaiat
uoiMuntrnriT
wBA?-eeresa- a la Kliat

KBST-Orcheit- ra

11330
KBST-Ne-

KRUP!stter Party
WPAA-M- el Cox's RanchBon
KBST-Orchest-ra

&KUFiatter Party
WPAA-M- el Cos'sRanchBeyy

KBST-Orchest-ra

sLi-T02aa- y cnnnlnahasj
WBAP-M-el Cox'sRanchBoys

10:00
KBST-New-s
KRLD-Ke-

WBAP-Me- et the Useks
10J3

KBST-Portral- ts laMelody
KRLD-Le- ts Pretend
WBAP-Me- et the Meets

1030
KBST-BoB-e Deass Cluk
KRLD--Xic- p"

WBAF-E- d McCesaeB
10:43

KRLD--rtea-p-

w&AF-E- a uccsanea
KBST-SIoc- Barata
KRLD-Theat- re of Today
wr&A-euna-ay b. lessee)

UX.5 .
KRLD-Re- v. Winiaaa
KRLD-Theat- re ef Today
WPAA-Dedjl- oa Row

1130
M. Zak

KRLD-Reco-rd Sao?
WPAA-Anehe- rs Awelgh

KRST-Hs- i. Mbi! W
KRLD-Reco- rd Shop
WFAA-Bln- e Barron Oreh.

4330
KBST-Treasu- ry Band
KRLD-Phllade- L 8ymphot9
WFAA-Oper- a

4:13
KBST-TTeara- rr Band
KRLD-Phllade- L Symphony
WFAA-Oper- a

430 .
KBSTJlelodles to Remember
KRLD-Phllade- L Sympboay
WFAA-CoHe- Chorss

4:43
KBST-Saturd- Swine
KRLD-Phllade- L Symphony
WFAA-Kln- s- Cole Trio

KBST-Em- le Fillet sartet
KRLD-Spor-ts race
WFAA-Bln- e Barron

3:15
KBST-Bfb- le Mestsse
KRLD-I- a My Opinio
WFAA-Ne-

330
KBST-Har- ry Wumer
KRLD-Ne-

WBAP-Ma- n ea the Fara
3:43

M World
KRLD-Ne-

WBAP-Ma- n ea the Fans
8ATURDAY EVENING

6.00 8:00 10330
KBST-Muxeu- m of af. Mails KBST-Ne-

KRLD-M- r. Ace it Jane KRLD-Joi- n Davis Show KRLD-New- s
WBAP-Curts- la Time WBAP-Yo- ur Hit Parade WFAA-Ne-

6:13 8:13 10:13 ,
KBST-Museu- m of Mutle rs KBST-Memo- ry Lane
KRLD-M- r. Ace & Jane KRLD-Joa- n Davis Show KRLD-Reco-rd Round OS
WBAP-Curts- ln Tims WBAP-Yo- ur Hit Parade WFAA-Sa- L Klx&t htniT

630 830 1030
KBST-Challen- te of Yukon KBST-Dle- k Jersens KBST-Fredd- y Martta
KRLD-Ab- e Burrows KRLD-Vaum- n Monroe Show KRLD-Dan- Parade
WBAP-&amm- y Ksye Oreh WBAP-Jud- r Cancrva WFAA-Ss- L Nlsbt witwiif

6.43 8.43 10:43
KBST-Challen-se of Yukoo KBST-Dle- k Jersens KBST-Fredd- y Msrtla

KRLD-Hort- y Carralchael KRLZVVaushn Monroe Show KRLD-Danc- e Parade
WBAF-new-s WBAP-Jud- y Canova WFAA-Colonl- al Ball

7 00 9.00 11330
KBST-Ne- KBST-Uutic- al Etchlnst KBST-Ne-

KRLD-"8uipen- ie' KRLD-Serens- KRLD-New-s
WBAP-LU- e ef Riley WBAP-Ka- y Kyser WFAA-Ne- ws

7:13 9:15 11:13
KBST-Melo- Parade KBST-Muslc- al Ztchlnss KBST-Orchest-ra

KRLD-"Suspens-e" KRLD-Serena- KRLD-Dan- Parade
WRAP-LU- e of Riley WBAP-Ka- y Xyser WFAA-L- s SaHe Oreh.

730 930 1130
KBST-Ju- ry Trials KBST-Swlnstl- Serenade KBST-Orchest-ra

KRLD-"8uipent- e" KRLD-Pa- yt to beInorant KRLD-Bar- n Dance
WBAP Consequences WBAP-Oran- a ole Opry WFAA-T- o Be Announced

7:43 9:45 11:43
KBST-Jur- y Trials KBST-Swlnstl- Serensde KBST-Orchest-ra

KRU"8uipente KRLD Part to Be Ignorant KRLD-Bar- a Danes
WBAP-Oran- d CU Opry



Steeds

Boxing Class

Starts Tonife
n,. ns.r cnrinr AtM.t?f snpia.i

rioas wnmmwill be tt--1

ed with a training session at p"
O'Dowdy's Sportatorium on East
Third street at 7:30 o'clock this
evening.

All boys interested in learning
the art of self defenseare Invited
to come out

Members of the city police force
will assist in conditioning the
youths.

K WEMTZmCUUKTlOKT

407RUHNElStf

Puckett & French
Architect andEngineer

Salt 60? Petroleum Bide

PHONE 747

Livestock Sales
ATTLE AUCTION
EVERY FRIDAY

West Texas
Livestock Auction

Owners:
L. Z. Beck and A. L. tTasson

Bx 968 Phone 1203
BIx Sprinr. Texas

Donalds
Drive-In-n

Specializingla

Mexican Foods
ud

Steaks
SAN ANGELO HIGHWAY

GREGG STREET

CLEANERS

Hatters Tailors
1706 Gregg Phone 21S8

"Fersoaal' Skilled Service"
SyedalixlBC In cleralnx sad

klekiac hits. Featsriaf EUnx

BrM. tailor-mad-e clothes.

Frank Rutherford
J. D. Elliott

i
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$59.95
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112 West 2nd

Play In Sweetwater
Saturday,

With TOMMY HART

"Walter Read, the high ictiool prof, lets it De Known mat uie
Kiwanis dub banquet for the Big Spring high school basketball team

be staged ,t the Settles hotel the night of Tuesday,May 11. Bill
Henderson, the very capable Baylor mentor, has been lined up as

speaker.
Henderson was commiuea 10 come nere xur we uuuuai cvcm.

April 1 but a developmentwhich had not cast its shadowbefore made
him concel out His Bruin basketball team, which had been doped to
lose in the first round of the Western NCAA tournament at Kansas
City went on to advanceto the semi-fina- ls of the Olympic tryouts at
New York.

Walter had asked Bill to bring his ace of aces, Jackie Robinson,
to the supper. The parson had to passup the offer, however. Seems
he has missedtoo many classesalready and can't spare another minute
away from his books.

Ducats can be obtained from any of the club members for $1.50
each.

STURDIVANT BESET WITH MANPOWER PROBLEMS
George Sturdivant, the Lamesabaseball skipper, is in a bad way

for ball players. The Lobos are up against it year in and year out
becausethey have no working agreement with a team of higher clas-

sification. Generally, they have to take what comestheir way.
Most of all, Sturdivant needsa catcher. He had Jack Wilcox work-

ing there one night, Jim Prince the next Neither ever played the
position before. Prince obviously felt like taking a hike after taking
a beating behind the dish here Wednesdaynight.

JakeMcCIain, Big Spring's secondsacker,bumpedhfm in the fifth
in a play at home and big Jim was never the sameafter that Jake
accusedPrince of blocking the plate.

Just when Jim got used to the postside slants of Lefty Leon
Hayes, Sturdivant upped and put in a righthander (Chris Haskins).
Then Prince had to accustomhimself to catching from the other side
and he seemingly never caught on.

LOBOS WEAK AT OTHER POSITIONS, TOO
Sturdivant could alsouse a shortstop, a third sackerand a

couple of lads to man the picket line, to sax nothing of more
pitchers.

LOCAL TEAM MAY BE ONE OF FASTEST IN BASEBALL
Never noted for its speed last year, the Big Spring team probably

is one of the fastest afoot In baseball this year.
Ace Mendez, the center fielder, is the speediest,man seen in this

section in a long. long while. He camehere with a reputation of being
quick but surprised even those who had looked for it.

Bobby Fernandez, the left fielder, is only a shade slower than
The Ace. Victor Hugo, the substitute right fielder, almost beat out a

blow that went directly to the pitcher the otherevening.
GeorgeSifff was recognizedas the speedmerchant of the Bridge-

port (Conn.) team last year and has already, given local fans pleasant
samplesof his running ability. JakeMcCIain is blue lightning once he
gets strung out and Is especially adept at moving from first to third
when someonehits behind him. ,

m

FERNANDEZ QUITE A HITTER IN CUBA LAST YEAR
Fesnandez,by the way, led a Cuban amateur league In hitting last

summer and those who are supposedto know insist he'll develop into
one of the better hitters of the Longhorn league.
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MustangsHere

For 3AA Game
Sweetwater's Mustangs, who

turned back Odessa'sBroncs a
3AA game last
Tuesday, come Big Spring
day to square away with Conn

Big Spring school
Steers Longhorn park.
time to be 3 o'clock.

JamesBoatman slated
to the hill for locals.

3AA contests today
Midland

Angelo Odessa
Odessa.
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Mendez Kayoes

Lubbock Hubs

With wins over two WT-N- M

league teams behind them, the Big

Spring baseball Broncs converge
uponSweetwaterSaturdaynight for
an exhibition go with Bill Gann's
Sports. Game time is 8 o'clock

Sunday the Hosses are booked

to appearin Lamesa for a return
contest with George Sturdivant's
Loboes.They come hpme Tuesday
to play PepperMartin's San An
gelo Colts in another nocturnal de
bate.

Ace Mendez's grand slam home
run, a blast that cleared theright
field barrier with yards to spare,
was the blow that propelled the
Big Spring Broncs to a 12-- 8 vic
tory over the Lubbock Hubbers in
an abbreviated baseball exhibition
here Thursday night.

The contest was called by agree
ment at the end of seven innings
due to cold weather. Despite the
temperature drop, around 600 fans
turned out to see Pat Stasey's ath-
letes and theWT-N- M leaguers ca
vort.

Jimmy Perez and Gerry Rodri- -

quez shoulderedpitching duties for
the locals and found the going easy
once their mates began to zero
their sights on Lefty Herby Pitts.

Rodriquez inherited a 7--3 lead in
the fourth inning and was In hot
water most every inning thereafter
but his partners-in-trad-e didn't let
him down. They tallied five runs
in the last two innings.

Mendez'sround tripper came aft-
er George Slfft, Armando Tras-puest-o

and Manny Cadalso had
worked Pitts for Annie Oakleys.
The Lubbock leftie settled mo-
mentarily to whiff Perez but
Mendezcaught up with him.

Georgie Lopez continued his
sterling stick work with two dou-
bles and a one-base- r.

Frank McAJexander rapped out
three singles for the visitors, who
were experiencing their first loss
of the 1948 campaign. Previous to
coming here, the Hubbers had won
four games.
Lubbock ABU HPOABmitn, ii i
MrAlexsnder, 3b s
Fowler, el 5
Richardson, lb :..., 4
Booth, xt 3
Walker, c 4
Altlser. If 1
Secrest. 2b 4
Pitts, p ... ,. 3

Totals 33 8 9 18 4
BIO. SPRING AB HPOAMtnati, cl 5 2 1
Lopei, 5 2 3
McCIain. 2b 3 1 1
Staser, rf 3 0 1
Huto.-r- f 0 0 0
Fernandez. If 4 1 0
81?". lb 2 1 0
Traspuesto. 2 2 1 "2Cadalso, 3b-- e- ...... ...,.'.2 .2 0.2J. Perer. p , "2 q O '0Rodriquez, p 2 1 2'0

Totals s 32 12 g Ji s
UJBBOCK4 . 102 211l-- - 8
BIO 8PRINTJ ... 2H 023 X 12
(Called seventh, cold)

Errors, Smith, Fowler. Secreit 3, Pitts
2, McCIain, Cadalso 3. Rodriquez; runs
batted in. McAJexander 2. Fowler 2,
Walker. Mende 4, Lopez. McCIain. 8ta-st-y.

Fernandez. Traipuesto. Rodrlauez
2; two bate hits. Lopez 2; home run,
Mendez; double plar, Lopez to McCalln
to Slfft; Jift on bates, Lubbock 10, Bis
Serins 8; earned runt. Lubbock 6, Ble
opnni 11; wua pucnes, Perez, Rldrlajiez,
PltU: hit br pitcher. Booth by Perez,
oates on balls, pff PltU 7. Perez 2.
Koanques 4: ttruck out. by Pitts 6,
Peres 3. Rodriquez 2. hits, off Perez.
0 lor 5 runs In 4 innines. winnlnspitcher. Perez. Umpires, FJler and Shep--
para. nmt, z:u.

Williams Sent

Home To Boston
BOSTON, April 9. ( New

England's hopes for an American
League pennant today rode toward
Boston with Ted
Williams, home
ward bound from
New Orleans in a
train berth for
a possiblessw it' 3WHH
appendectomy.

The slugging
Red Sox outfield
er missed eleven
successive spring ssisisisisisisisisisisisisisisHPf4,r

training exhibi-
tion games be-

cause of a back
Ted Williamsinjury and was

held out of a 12th because of a
cold.

Should an operation be neces-
sary it is estimated that Williams
and his potent bat would be lost
to the strengthened'Sox for three
to six weeks.His loss would great-
ly weaken the Boston attack.

OPENING OF

THE, PERMANENT, NEW

PALACE ROLLER RINK
(Air ConditionedWinter & Summer)

Saturday,April 1 0

2 P. M. yTil 1 1 P. M.

We will featurea floor show at 10 o'clock Saturday
night. For health'ssake, roller skate at the Palace

rink every night. Air conditionedfor your comfort!

Skating Sunday Afteroon3-- 5

OpenEachAfternoon 3-- 5

Each Evening 7:30 - 10

Herd Descends

Upon Midland

For 3AA Meet
Mule Stockton takes his Big

Spring high school track and field

team to Midland Saturday where
it will competein the 1948 District
3AA meet.

Five schools, in addition to Big

Spring, will be represented at the
games. Odessa, Sweetwater. Abi
lene and San Angelo, in addition
to the host school, will have ath-

letes entered.
Odessa is favored to take the

team title but Big Spring and Abi-

lene should score heavily. The
Steers are especially strong in the
distance races and may pick up a
few points in the weights, the pole
vault and the broad Jump.

Leon Lepard bids fair to be the
Steers' leading point getter. The
good-lookin- g senior should win the
880 yard run in record time, will
anchor the mile relay teams that
cleaned up on every thing here
last week and will take time out
to compete in the broad jump.

JamesFannin bids fair to finish
well in the mile run. Jim Bill Little
should be up front in the 440. Ike
Robb and Delmar Turner will toss
the weights.Harold Berry will com-
pete In the pole vault.

Gordon Madison a-- .d Bobby Fox
will enter the sprints:

First, secondand third place fin-

ishers in the meet qualify for the
Regional games in Abilene two
weekendshence.

Rookie Basemen

Major League Outfits

NEW YORK, April 9. W "Who's tello the 16 major league

on first?"
The baseball fan who asks that

question this year is .going to get
a lot of new answers.

In a series of moves almost as
confusing as the Abbott and Cos--

Hogan Trailing

Lloyd Mangrum

By Stroke
AUGUSTA, Ga., April 9.

other pros and amateurs con-

templated the 69 shot by Lloyd
Mangrum in the opening round of

the 12th annual Master's golf tour-

nament yesterday with some ap-

prehensionas they teed off for the
second18 holes of the 72-ho-le event
today.

Mangrum, whose three-under-p- ar

score led the field by one stroke,
came here as the leading money
winner of the winter tour. A year
ago Jimmy Demaret came here as
the leading money winner, took the
lead on the first round, and held
it until the finish. Sixteen players
were par or better for yesterday's
play over the 6,000 yard layout with
its rolling terrain,undulating, sand-isolate- d

greens and tree fringed
fairways. Among them were most
of the entrants rated outstanding
contenders in cal
culations.

Missing the select circle by one
stroke was Defending Champion
Jimmy Demaret, bracketed with
jsix others at 73, playing with Bobby
Jones. Demaret was out in 37 and
back in par 36. Jonescame in with
a 76.

One stroke behind the sizzling
Mangrum were ClaudeHarmon, Ed
Furgol, Ben Hogan and Herman
Keiser, the surprise winner two
years ago, and in the 71 bracket
were Skee Riegel, National Ama-

teur champion; Art Bell, Dick
Metz, Chick Harbert. Jim Ferrier,
Bobby Locke, the South African
threat, and Byron Nelson, a two-tim-e

winner.
Hanly Cotton of England, the sec-

ond foreign threat, was one of the
four matching par 72. His com-
panions were Harry Todd, Bob
Hamilton and Weland Gibson.

Weather and course conditions
approachedthe ideal yesterday un-

til late in the afternoon when a
roistering wind, accompanied by
ominous skies and driving rain
squalls caught a few of the late
starters.

Fire Bomb
In Armour

FORT WORTH, April 9. W A

fire bomb thrown at the home of
an Armour & Company employe
yesterday failed to explode.

It was the seventh fire bomb
thrown at homes of company em-

ployes. Two city detectives have
been assigned to cases.

Mrs. Earl A. White said she
heard the home-mad- e bomb land
on the front porch.

White has been on sick leave
from the plant, where the United
PackinghouseWorkers (CIO) have
been on strike since March 16.

BUY RCA VICTOR
And You Know You

Have The Best
THE RECORD SHOP

Phone 230

duAMlots C
BujaONERD

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS
For Appointment Call

ELROD FURNITURE CO.
Phone 1635

EXTENDS 20 WEEKS

Tri-Coun- ty League
OpenScheduleOn

First Take Over

With Ten
routine,

One

Thrown
Dispute

Cats Favorites

In Tennis Meet
San Angelo's Bobcats are fa-

vored to win the District 3AA
tennis tournament, which gets un
derway in Midland today arid con
tinues through Saturday.

Bill Montgomery appears to be
Big Spring's best bet to finish "in

the money'.
All 3AA schools will have repre-

sentatives in the tournament.
Winners will be eligible to com-

pete in play.

Driving Range

OpensAt Muny
The driving range at the Muny

golf courseopenedfor businesslast
night and will function from 5:00
to 10:30 p. m. nightly except Sun-

days and Mondays.Tho facility will

also be open on Sundayafternoons.
The range will be operated by

Foy Fanning, Muny pro, and Gene
Killingsworth.

clubs have tried practically every

body except Happy Chandler at
first base.

The net result is that only six
full time regulars of last year are
expected"back at their old stands,
comes opening day, 1948.

A couple more teams will pre-

sent players who joined them dur-

ing the 1947 season.And at least
two outfits the Brooklyn Dodgers
and the St. Louis Cardinals are
apt to have most anybody at the
initial sack.

Returning in the Americanleague
are the aging George McQuinn of
the New York Yankees, currently
ailing Ferris Fain of the Philadel-
phia A's, and Mickey Vernon, one
time batting king, of the Washing-
ton Senators.

In the National league, Johnny
Mize of the New York Giants, Ed-

die Waitkus of the Chicago Cubs,
and Earl Torgeson of the Boston
Braves will be back.

Rookies are certain to man the
bag for the Chicago White Sox, the
Detroit Tigers, the St. Louis
Browns and the Pittsburgh Pirates.

Tony- - Lupien, who hit .341 for
Hollywood in the Pacific Coast
league, will be at first for the
White Sox. GeorgeVico, a .30T hit-
ter at Portland in the same cir-
cuit, will be the Tiger starter, and
Chuck Stevens,back after a year
at Toledo, will start for the Browns.
Ed Stevens, once of the Dodgers
and more recently of Montreal,
will be in the lineup for the Pirates.

The Boston Red Sox have Jake
Jones, who played 109 games for
them after coming from, the White
Sox last year. Willard Robinson,
a part-tim- er in 1947, and Elbie
Fletcher, late of the Pirates, will
divide the duties In Cleveland.

SweetwaterTops

Tribe In Opener
SWEETWATER, April 9 The

SweetwaterSports won their open-
ing conteston the spring exhibition
schedule here last night by taking
a 9 to 3 decision over the Midland
Indians. The Indians are also on
an exhibition swing, headed into
East Texas.

The Sports, behindstarter Calien
McPike, got off to a two-ru- n first
inning lead andwere neverheaded.
Only four extra base blows were
served up during the contest,one a
double by Mack Dunlap in the
seventh that accounted for three
runs. Beringer, of Sweetwater,also
got a double while Stewart and
Jakeshad two-basse-rs for Midland.
Midland 000 100 0203 6 2
S'water 201 010 32x 9 6 5

Blair, Stewart (5), Willlngsburg
(7) and Webb; McPike, Garner
(6) and Pacock, Nutt (6).

Big Spring
SteamLaundry

Good'Service
DependableWork

121 West First Phone 17

ONLY IN
ROA VICTOR

Can you get superb teat
quality.

THE RECORD SHOP
Phone 239

Johnny't

ROUND TOP
Best Foods
CourteousService
Coldest Beer In Tom

CURB SERVICE

JohnnyTibbets, Owner
2401 Scurry Phone 9560

Big Spring (Texas) Herald,

Play in the Tri-Coun- ty Independ
ent baseball league gets under
way on three fronts Sunday after
noon and continues for 20 weeks.

Forsan goes to Coahoma,the Big
Spring Westernersinvade Colorado
City and Howard County Junior
college will be the guest of Knott
in initial contests.

First half play will be ended
June 13 while regular activity
winds up August 22. First and sec
ond half champions meet at sea-
son's end for the title.

Tbt sehtdulc: '
April 11 Forssn st Coshams. West-

erners t Colorado Cltr. HCJC st Knott
April 18 Westerners st Tonan. Knott

t Cosboms. ColorsdoCltr st HCJC?
April 23 Forssn st Knott. Coahoma

st Colorado Cltr. HCJC ti iWeiterneri
at Bit Sprinr.

May 3 Colorsdo Cltr st Forssn. Knott
ts Westerners at Bit Sprinr. HCJC at
coanoms.

mst v Forsan at HCJC. Knott at
Colorado Cltr. Coahoma ts Westerners
at Blr 8prlnr.

Mar 16 Coahoma at Forsan. Colorsdo
Cltr ts Westerners at Bis Sprinr. Knott
at HCJC

Mar 23 Westerners ts Forasn at Blr
8prlnr. Coahomaat Knott. HCJC at Colo
rado citr.

Mar 30 Knott at Forsan. Colorsdo
Cltr at Coahoma. Westerners at HCJC

June fi Forsan at Colorado Cltr. West
erners at Knott. Coahomaat HCJC.

June 13 HCJC at Forsan. Colorsdo
iitr st Knott, westernersat Coahoma.

(End of flrst half of plar).
June 30 ForsanV at Coahoma. West

erners at Colorado Cltr. HCJC at Knott.
June 37 Westerners at Forssn. Knott

at coanoma. Colorado Cltr at HCJC
Julr 4 Forsan at Knott. Coahoma at

Colorado Cltr. HCJC ts Westerners at
Blr Sprinr.

Julr 11 Colorsdo Cltr at Forssn. Knott
ts Westerners at Blr Sprinr. HCJC at
coanoma.

Julr IS Forsan at HCJC. Knott at
Colorado Cltr. Coahoma ts Westerners
at Blr Sprinr.

Julr 23 Co shorn s at Forsan. Colorsdo
Cltr ts Westerners at Blr Sprinr. Knott
at HCJC.

Aurust 1 Forsan ts Westernsrs at Blr
Sprinr. Coahomaat Knott. HCJC at Colo
rado Cltr.

Autuat 8 Knott at Forssn. Colorado
Cltr at Coahoma. Westerners at HCJC.

Aurust 13 Forssn at Colorado Cltr,
westerners at Knott Coahoma at HCJC.

Auruit 22 HCJC at Borssn. Colorsdo
iiir st Knott, westerners at Coahoma.

if r in GET PEP..
H BtH Do Ten want ta !

rounr WhjfI old at 19. 10 ormors7 snior routhful pleasureseg-ai- Ifadded rearshare slowed down your Tim andTiUllty. just to to your drurgist sad askfor Caltran stimulating tablets. Many men
are obtaining-- rraarkabls results with thisamssins; formula.
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PackageStore

lli Miles E. Hwy. M

"Jimmle Says See HEX

For The Beet Ii liqwr
and Beer"

rf"sllsssssssssss.

BRING IT TO US FOR

FORD SPECIAL

utca&H
ii KMEft-UmR- "

Ws use the btt, factory-recommend-ed

tabricaot
and do th Job the way
the Ford factory
ice engineers

BIG SPRINOf
MOTOR CO.
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USE

READY MIX

CONCREtE
Scientific Convcnitnt Economical
Concrete ContractorsHcadquarttrs

Whtn in nttd of any kind of conerttt
work large of small

CALL
WEST TEXAS SAND & GRAVEL

PHONE 9000

DANCE
To The Music Of

SunshineButler
And His Orchestra

At The

American Legion Ciub Houst

Saturday, April 10

Admission $1 Per PersonPlus Tax

PULIC INVITED
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Bnsi
Cleaning & Blocking

Furniture

EXCLUSIVE
DEPENDABLE

HATTERS
PACTORT UETHOD&

LAWSON
Hat Works

S03 Runnel

PICKLE

and
CRENSHAW

New and Used Furniture
Furniture Repairing

Sewing Machines
We keep a variety of wall

paper Cecil Nabors will esti-

mate any Job large or small.
We Pick-U- p and Denver
607 E. Second Ph. 260

We Buy. Sell. Bent and

trade new and used furniture

Hill & Son

Furniture
504 West 3rd Phone 2122

O. R. SMITH

USED FURNITURE
WE tfTJY.SELL and TRADE

If you want to sell furniture
cf anykind, see us.

218W 2nd St Phone 9650

J. R. CREATH
Furniture and

Mattresses
New and used furniture. Serv-

ing you for the past 30 years.
SEE US tuaai.

Bear of 710 E. 3rd. Ph. 602

When buying or selling

good used furniture, compare

our prices.

P.Y. TATE
Furniture

1000 W-- 3rd. Phone 1291-- W

Special
Service

Garages

lafJlUlalal
VtJSPTCgSX

For All
Cars

9 Starter Lighting
Ignition Battery

Brake Service

Motor Tune Up Carburetor
General Repairing
Wlllard Batteries

Authorized United Motor
Service

McCrary Garage
S05 W. 3rd . Phone 257

GENERAL AUTO
REPAIR

Specialize In motor tune up
and brake repair

-- Corner N. Aylford St Lamesa
Highway

JACK FRANKLIN
GARAGE
Pnone 1678

.ATTENTION.
Derington Auto Parts, ma-

chine shop and garagewill be
open until 12:00 midnlghL We
carry only the best in Stand-

ard brands of automobile
parts.
Complete machineshop equip-
ment: also have a supply of
new and rebuilt motors.
Our service Department Is
well equipped. Your car will
be repaired by skilled mechan-
ics. We specialize In motor

'tuneup.
O. H-- DERINGTON, Owner

JACK B ROGERS.
300 N. E. 2nd Phone 1153

NOTICE
Tailored Seat Covers

LEWIS SHEEN
600 West 3rd. Street

NOTICE

GriUs, springs and generators
for any make automobiles;
fuel pump exchange; floor
mats; full line of other parts
and accessories. Why pay
more when you can buy for
less; wholesale or retail.

f. ARNOLD'S
GARAGE AND AUTO PARTS

201 N.W. 2nd Phone 1476

M. O-- Hamby and
Son

702 WEST THIRD
PHONE 2276 .

Bring Tour Car Where Your
BusinessIs Appreciated.

Our Work Is Guaranteeo
And Our Prices Are Right ,

All Jobs Given Prompt
Service

No Repair Job Too Small
Or' Too Large

Directorj
Laundry Service

MAY-TA- G LAUNDRY
Best Way To Wash

Handiest Laundry tn town, nollta
soft water, courteous terrlca: rood

202 W 14th Phone 9595

Machine Shop

HENLEY
Machine Company

General Machine Work
Portable Welding

Also Representatives of
Harmon Process Company.

Any type casting repair
'Blocks. cylinders and beads

All work guaranteed
1811 Scurry Day phone 9576

Night Phone 1319

Mattresses

Big Spring Mattress
Factory

HAVE your mattress made In-

to a new Innerspring. Call for
free estimate. New mattresses
made to order.

Phone 1764 811 W. 3rd

503

Plumbing

PLUMBING
Prichard and

Clark

Work Done Right
Priced Right

N. Gregg Phone 855

Rendering

FREE REMOVAL
OF UNSKINNED

DEAD ANIMALS

BIG SPRING RENDERING
St CO.

Call 1283 or 153 Collect
Home owned and operated by
Marvin Sewell and Jim
Ki'nsey

Phone 1037 or 1519 Nights
Sunday.

FOR FREE REMOVAL Or
DEAD ANIMALS

(UNSKINNED- -

CALL 1556, COLLECT
Big Spring Animal Rendering

Works

Roofing

r8

We
new.

fc
s

,&

&Z&&

Radio Repair

G. B. PARKS

RADIO REPAIR
make them like

All Work Guaranteed

Pick Up and Deliver

Phone233

Trailers

operate

HYDRAULIC
JACK REPAIR
Precision machine work.

Radiator Grill guards and
bumpers.Trailer hitches ready
to install Small winches niadp.
winches installed. Aluminum
trailers (cattle, horse, general
purpose) one wheel, with
wheels to fit your car.

Trailers for rent
SAVAGE

Manufacturing Co.
Phone 593 806 E. 15th

Termite Extermination

TERMITES
WELLS

EXTERMINATING CO.
FREE INSPECTION

1419 West Ave D. '
San Angela, Texas

Phone 5056
Prompt Attention

Vacuum Cleaners

NEW VACUUM
CLEANERS COMPLETE

DELIVERED NOW

?m&
Nationaly advertised Eureka
that sweeps and polishes in
one operation and GE's
famous super, cleaner, the
Premier, In tanks and up-

rights. All makes used clean-
ers guaranteed.
All makes serviced to factory
specifications for patrons oi
Texas Electric Service Co. in
ten towns.

22 Years Experience
Cleaners For Rent

West of Cowper Clinic
G BLATN LUSE Phone 16

BURLESON

Welding Shop
Clothes Line Poles

Trailers Manufactured
Farm MacHery Repaired

1102 W. 3rd Phone 796--W

AUTOMOTIVE
1 Used Cars For Salo

ATTENTION
1947 Ford Pickup
1946 Chevrolet
1942 Studebakcr
1941 Nash 600
1941 Chevrolet Tudor
1941 Ford Club Coupe
1941 Ford Tudor
1940 Chevrolet panel
1939 Oldsmobile 6
1939 Chrysler Royal

T. W. GRIFFIN
Phone 2340

4th and Johnson

GUARANTEED
USED CARS

1946 Nash Ambassador
1942 Ford Sedan
1941 Chevrolet Tudor
1941 Studebaker Commander
1941 Ford Tudor
1942 Studebaker Champion
1940 Model Chevrolet coupe

Pickup.
1939 Chevrolet Coupe
1939 Ford Tudor
1934 Ford Sedan
1947 Studebaker M ton pickup
1939 on Ford pickup
1937 Ford Tudor

Mcdonald
Motor Company

Phone 2174 206 Johnson

York & Pruitt
NEW and USED CARS

1946 Hudson, prettiest thing
in town, worth the money.

1947 Buick Super Convertible;
all extras.

1946 Chevrolet Convertible
all extras.

1947 Chrysler Windsor, all
extras.

1947 Dodge town sedan, all
extras; whitewall tires and
custom red upholstery.

1946 Plymouth worth
money.

Variety of Cheaper Cars.

310 W. 3rd

J. B. STEWARD

Used Cars
501 WEST THIRD

1947 Chevrolet Aero, lots of
extras, like new.

1946 Ford Tudor.
1946 DeSoto Sedan.
1941 Dodge Tudor.
1941 Ford Tudor.
1941 Ford Tudor Sedan,clean
1940 Chevrolet Tudor.
1937 Chevrolet Coupe

REO TRUCKS

Sales & Service

1930 Pontine, good tires. $200. L. F.
Brothers, 704 Runnels, Phone 2319-- J.

1941 Ford Convertible for sale. See
Morris Crittenden at 209 E. Park,
or phone 1489.

NOTICE
1948 model Chevrolet two ton

2 speed short wheel base
truck.

1940 Nash Sedan, radio and
heater.

1942 Dodge Tudor Sedan
1942 Chevrolet Truck IV2 ton,

2 speed axle.
1940 Mercury convertible

radio and heater, extra
clean.

JonesMotor Co.
101 Gregg Phone

Variety of Used Cars
Models 1934 through 1939

Prices $150 to $650

ARNOLD'S

Garage & Auto

Parts
Phone 1476 201 N.W. 2nd St
1937 Four door Plymouth for sale:
new reconditioned motor. 205 N Aus-
tin. Call after 1 p. m.
194S Roadmaster Buick. very clean.
first class condition. See SI at 4th
and North Gregg.

1935 Plymouth for sale; has
new upholstery: fair shape: a real
buy at $275. See at Mason's Oarage,
207 N. W. 4th, Phone 2127.

GOOD cheap cars. 1934 four door
Chevrolet, new tires. $265.: 1937 Olds-mobi- le

coupe; good $350.: 1938
tudor Chevrolet, and take pay-
ments; newly overhauled. 301 E.
Park.

555

tuddr

tires,
S400.

1940 Ford Four door Sedan for sale;
radio and heater. 1946 Plymouth
four door sedan for saleor trade;
both cars extra clean. 1226 W. 3rd.
Owl Tourist Court. Phone 9546.

PERSONAL car for sale. 1941 Pon-Ua-

four door Sedan. See at Hom-
er's Grocery. 201 Runnels.
4 Trucks
1947 Dodge Dump truck for sale,
$1700. Truck on years job. Phone
2591, after 7:00 p. m. Ackerly. Texas

5 Trailers, Trailer Houses
6 ft auto trailer for sale; steel
body; 600 x 16 4 ply tfres. 1408
Scurry. Phone 1387.

1941 Factory built trailer for sale;
made by Plymouth; must sell Im-

mediately. 4950. or make offer. Be-

hind 1400 W. 5th.
TWO wheel stock trailer for sale.
408 E. 10th. Phone 2305--

I have a 1947 Glider House Trailer
for sale; 23 ft. long, all metal top
and body. The tires like new, having
only 1500 actual miles on them.
Electric refrigerator, automaUc hot
water heater, butane gas stove, in-
nerspring mattress and

equipped with Stewart-Warn- er

electric bracts. Venetian blinds,
price includes hydraulic jack, fire
extinguisher, two chairs and exten-
sion cord. $2250 cash, will deliver
trailer to any place up to 150 miles
from San Angelo Phone 3831-- San
Angelo or write 309 Klstler St, San
Angelo.

1942 Model Continental tandem Trail
er house: sleeps four: 28 ft Ion;
fully equipped, ready for use. S1500.
See at 206 Lexington Ave. or phoneI

2536V. f

ANNOUNCEMENTS
10 Lost and Found
REWARD tor return of. or Informa-
tion leading to return of large, rusty
brown Collie Dog. strayed from Chalk
Electric Substation. Notify E. O.
French at Substation or call Big
Spring 9028.

11 Personals
CONSULT Estella the Reader, now
located at 703 East 3rd street Next
to Banner Creamery.
OLD AT 40. 50. 60? MAN You're
crazy! Thousands peppy at 70. x

Tonic Tablets pco up bodies
lacking Iron. For rundown feeling
many men, women call "eld " New
"get acquainted" size only 50 cents.
At all druggists In Big Spring, at
Collins Bros. Drug Store.
LEARN TO FLY at Hamilton Field,
one mile North city: Phone 1140.
14 Lodges

-- ( HI

A
sv

w

STATED ConvocationBig
spring' Chapter 178.
R.A.M.. every 3rd Thurs
day at 7:30 p. m.

Bert Shlve. HP.
W. O. Low. Sec.

MULLEN Lodge 372
IOOF meets every Mon-
day night Building 318
Air Base, 8:00 p. m.
Visitors welcome.

Charlie Boyd. N.O.
Elra Phillips. VO.
C E. Johnson, Jr.,

Recording Sec
CALLED meeting Staked
Plains Lodge. No. 598
A. F. and A. M., Wednes-
day, Apr. 14 at 7:00 p
m. Work In F. C degree

E. R. Gross. W. M.
W O. Low, Sec.

Regular meeting of
Knights of Pythlai
each Tuesday evenlni
at 7:30 at Trinity Bap
tist Church. East 4tn
and Benton All mem
bers urged to attend

L. D. Chrane,
Chancellor Commander

16 Business Service

NOW OPEN
Cupid Inn Cafe.'

Special Lunch, 75c
Regular Lunch, 50c

Sunday chicken dinner, 75c
Hot biscuits, co'rn bread

M. D. CHEEK, prop.

304 East Third

COMMERCIAL

AND

HOUSEHOLD
Storage

BIG SPRING

BONDED WAREHOUSE

and STORAGE. INC.

LOCAL & LONG
DISTANCE HAULING

Anywhere, Anytime
Authorized Permit

G. G. Morehead
Manager

101 Lancaster Phone 2635

SPECIAL
SPRING TUNE-U- P

$9.80 plus parts needed
Special Tune-U-p Includes:

Remove and Recondition
Carburetor

Remove and Recondition
Distributor

Clean and Adjust Spark Plugs
Test CompressionOn All

Cylinders
Test Fuel Pump
Set Distributor Timing
Adjust Service Brakes, Add

Fluid
Wash
Lubricate
Change Motor Oil
ChangeFilter Cartridge

JonesMotor Co.

Phone 555 101 Gregg
Dodge - Plymouth

Dodge Job Rated Trucks

Coldiron Garage

811 E. 2nd. Phone 2166

Day or Night

General auto repair. Our work
is guaranteed and our prices
are right. All jobs given
prompt service, no repair job
too small or too large.

8TACEY"8 BEWINO MACHINE
EXCHANGE

Repair and parts: motorizing; Scis-
sors sharpened.
705 Main Phone 2491

STATE Farm Insurance Companies,
Fir and Automobile. Harold D. Stov-al- L

Agent. 905 Lancaster, Phone
2449--

a:p'scafe
We Specialize In

Steaks and Sandwiches
Cold Drinks

Eat with us and be pleased.
Cleanest little cafe West of
Big Spring.

Across from Yell's Inn.

Highway 80

N EEL'S

State Bonded

StorageWarehouse

TRANSFER & DEPENDABLE

VAN SERVICE

Crating - Packing - Shipping

Fire Proof Building

100 S. Nolan. Big Spring

PHONE 1323

ANNOUNCEMENTS
16 BusinessService
RADIO repairing, large ttoek of
tubes and parts Baseoall. i oft ball
equipment Musical merchandise.
Phone 856. 113 Main.

HOUSE LEVELING
FOUNDATION WORK

Concrete work, emtermlnatlng, car
penter repairs, roofing, free esti-
mates. R. Carter. Phone 1739-- J. 804
San Antonio St.
IF you are having house trouble.
See J A. Adams, 1007 W. 5th. He
will build you a house and give
terms. Phone 1603--J.

17 Woman's Column
BELTS Covered oucxlei and but
tons, eyelets, buttonholes. Mrs. H. V
Crocker. 1707 Benton. Phone 653--J

WILL do Ironing tor people who live
at Ellis Homes: guaranteed work;
will also wash and Iron girls' uni-
forms Bldg 28. Apt 5. Ellis Homes.

Day and Night Nursery
Mrs. Foresyth at 1104 Nolan Street
keeps children all hours Phone
2010--

LUZIER'S fine perfumes and cos-
metics. Phone 653--J. 1707 Benton.
Mrs H. V Crocker.

MRS Tipple. 207 W 6th does all
kinds of sewing and alterations
Phone 2136--

ALTERATIONS
Men's and Women's Clothes

If they don't fit. bring them
Mrs O. C. Potts.
1009 Main Street

EXPERT alterations on all gar-
ments; years of experience; Mrs.
J L. Haynes. 710 Main. Phone

BUTTONHOLES
Belts, buckles, covered buttons, eye-
lets. naUheads. Mrs J. S Martin.
709 N Oregg Street
I keep children by week, day, night
or hour, best of care and do nice
tewing 1002 W 6th Street.
BOY clothing for all the family
below cost by shopping with us.
All kinds sewing and alterations
The Peerless Shop. 115 Runnels.

SPENCER
Foundation garment supports for ab-

domen, back and breast For women,
men and children Doctor's orders
filled Phone 2111 after S:30. 1300
Lancaster.
KEEP children day or night; con-
venient for working mother. 1 block
from town, 307 W. 3rd.

vfl
All machine permanents on

special.
Complete line of Revelon pro-

ducts and Contoure
Cosmetics.

NABORS

Permanent Wave
Shop

PHONE 1252

SPENCER

Individually
designed.
Breast and
Surgical sup-ort- s.

Dealer
Mrs. Lou A.

Lambert
509 W. 4th

PHONE
1129--

STANLEY
Home Products

Mrs. C. B. Nunley

206 E 18th Phono 2252-- J

MRS. E. F Tldwell does Ironing
1800 block West Fourth, look for
sign.

WILL keep your children at your
homt or at my home: reasonable
rates Set Juanlta Bait 407 Galves--
ton.

MAKE covered button buckes.
belts, button holes, baby sweater
sets, and sewing of all kinds. Mrs
T E Clark, 208 N. W 3rd.
CHILD care nursery; care for chil-
dren all hours; weekly rates. Mrs. Aa Hale, 506 E. 12th.
WILL keep your children In your
home, day or night best of caie.
Mrs. Clara Smith. 006 Bell. Phuiie
726--

HEMSTITCHING at 810 V, 5th. St..
Phone 1461--

EMPLOYMENT
22 Help Wanted Male
YOUNG man. 18-2-5. High School
graduate, single,neat free to travel
to assist salesman with survey.
Must be ambitious: Rapid uromo--
tlon. Transportation furnished. See
Mi. Goodnight Hotel Settles, Tours
day, 10:30 a m.

WANTED- - Man for good selling Job.
Experiencenot necessary: Will train.
Earnings $60. per week or more.
See B. Johnson, 8Q7 W. 4th between
12 and 2 p. m.

NATIONAL Food Distributor has
opening for aggressive young man
to sell and distribute food products;
must have space at home for office
and some merchandise storage: ex-

tra compensation will be allowed
for storage space.Box D. N. C.

o Herald.
FOR

Join the U. S. Air Force
Far places are within your reach-alon-g

with the fart moving Ufe-wh-

you Join the U. S. Air Force. Young
men are finding that out for them-
selves by enlisting for three years
and choosing assignment to this
great pioneering Service
If you're between 17 and 34 years
old, and have the stuff It takes,
you can be a part of the Air Force.
Good, pay. education, and many oth-
er unequalled benefits make this a
top opportunity for the right man.
Can you measure up Ask at your
U. S. Army and U. S Air Force
Recruiting Station, Basement Post
Office Bldg.. Big Spring.

301 'Third

to

EMPLOYMENT
22 Help Wanted Male
WANTED: Men to train for Dics'l
Electric and Heavy Duty Equipment
work: write the Greer Shop Train-
ing. 808 Hermann Bids.. Houston. 2.
Texas.
HAVE opening for A- -l Sober me-
chanic." Apply McDonald Motor Co..
Phone 2174.

WANTED: One cook's helper, also
waitress with food experience for
Saturday's only. Casino Club, Phone
0581.

HAVE opening In Big Spring terri
tory for a reliable party to nanaie
our Cast-Cret- e Water-proofin- This
is a good clean business proposition
for the right party-- . Come to see or
write us for particulars. L. M. Castor
& Sons. 19 E. Avenue D., San o.

Texas.
23 Help Wanted Female
CASHIER and bookkeeper wanted:
must be permanent; apply Franklin's
Ready-to-wea- i.

WANTED:
ord Shop.

A- -l bookkeeper at Rec--

AIRUNE TRAININa
Airline training for hostess reserva-
tions, teletype and radio-phon- e com-
munications. Women needed for the
big airlines. Short time training
qualifies yoir for a pleasant well-pa- id

position In the air transport in
dustry. Learn in residence or by
extension In scare time If desired
without Interference with your pres
ent employment. Write district man-
ager.

MIDWESTERN SCHOOLS
P. O. Box 785. Joplln, Missouri

FINANCIAL
31 Money To Loan

J. E. Duggan

PERSONAL LOANS

No Indorsen No Security

FinanceService

Company

105 MAIN PHONE 1591

MONEY
Quick - Easy

$5 . . . $50

If you borrow elsewhere,you
can still

Borow Here
i

We havehelpedyour friends

Why Not You

People's
Finance & Guaranty Co..

Crawford Hotel Building

PHONE 721

LOANS
$5.00 to $1,000.00

PERSONAL LOANS To
steadily employed up to $50.
No red tape no cosigner re-

quired.
AUTOMOBILE LOANS

Drive in by side of office for

QUICK SERVICE, compare
our rates monthly payments.

Security Finance
Company

J. B. COLLINS. Mgr.

FOR SALE

40 Household Goods
THREE piece sectional couch and
occasional chair for sale. Bldg. 3,
Apt. 5, Ellis

TWIN metal beds and vanity dres-
ser for sale. 101 Lancaster, Big
Spring Bonded Warehouse.
THREE piece wicker set for sale,
couch and two chairs, $20. Phone
2483--

FOUR ft. Kelvinator electric refrig-
erator for sale, $75. C. E. Read.
Phone 169-- 503 Main.
BEDROOM suite for sale: Inner-sprin- g

mattress: good condition: a'so
dinette suite. Bldg. 27. Apt. 3. Ellis
Homes.

FOR SALE: Nice 75 lb. enameled
finished Ice box. 109 W. 22nd. Phone
607--

FOR sale cheap; baby buggy, prac
tically new. Phone 1362 or see at
1000 .Oregg.

LOOK
IT'S SENSATIONALI

IT'S PORTABLEI

We are having a .whole week
of free demonstrations, no
obligation. It's new, It's dif-
ferent, adjustable ventilation.
The one and only Air Flow
Air conditioner. It's portable
for the home,the cabin, trailer
house. No outside connection.
no hose,no pipe, no open win
dow, unbelievable but true.

Hill & Son

Furniture

504 West 3rd. Phone 2122

IF YOU NEED A GOOD USEDCAR
WEE GOT IT.

1941 Chevrolet Tudor, Radio and Heater $1195
1941 Buick Special $1195
1940 Ford Radio $890
1939 Chevrolet Tudor, Radio $ 850

1948 License PaidOn All Cars Sold By Us

AND MANY OTHERS
YOUR FRIENDLY DEALERS

FOWLER & HARMONSON
East

Homes.

Phone 1580 71--W j

FOR SALE
40 Househoia Goods
PRACTICALLY new innerspring
mattress, dinette suite, chest of
drawers, heater. Phone 1737--

SIMMONS mattress and springs for
half bed, S20. Phone 2191-- J.

9 x 12 ft. linoleum rugs. S8.95: new
four piece poster bedroom suite.
$104.95: apartment ranges, $57.50 up;
new dining room chairs. $2.85. Ba-
rney Furniture. 1207 E. 3rd.
LATE model Hoover vacuum cleaner
with attachments forsale. Phone 703,

Sewing Machines
FOR SALE

Used Singer Consoles,
Portables andTreadles.'
Sold Under Guarantee.

112 E. 2nd Street

42 Musical Instruments

New Spinet Pianos

Baldwin - Wurlitzer
Betsy Ross

Jesse French St Sons
Band Instruments

Olds Selmer Holton

Terms Free Delivery

Harley Elliott, Piano Tuner

Adair Music

Store

1708 Gregg SL Phone 2137

44 Livestock

VIC

wBSBBSBBBmmM

Reg. P.H.B.A. 6837
Beautiful Palomino Stallion

At Stud.
Fees $25.00

FrancesWeeg
Phone 832

1308 Scurry SL
Big Spring, Texas

45 Pets
THREE-quart- Cocker Spaniel pups
for sale. 107 E. 12th Street
CANARIES for sale, mated pairs:
some with eggs; new cages: 1-

price. Mrs. Ned Boyles. 407 Bell.
Phone 1129--J.

48 Building Materials

LUMBER
2x4, 2x6, 1x4. Ix6and-Shipla- p.

Commodes.and lavatories.

2 miles West on Highway 80

Mack & Everett

SHEETROCK. 8
1110 N. BelL

1- -2 cents per ft.

LUMBER
Buy direct gave 30 per cent
Fir Dimension $6.50 to S7.00 per hd
Fir one inch Lumber $7.00 per hd.
Inside Doors S9.00 and 39.50 eich
24 x 24 window and frame $10.50
each
Close prices on yellow pine lumber
We deliver anywhere in Texas.
Prices F. O. B. Ft Worth
Castleberry Lumber Co. '.

Hiway 80 Rt 5. Box 4047-660-1

49-- A Miscellaneous

WAR SURPLUS
Get Good Merchandise for

Less Money
Camp Stoves, used 2.95

Also nice for back yard use.
Navy Life Belts 1.95
Boats. 5 man. hew. rubber 37SO
Beach Mattresses 15.93 and 18.95
Mattress Covers, nice 1 65

white 79c
Shorts, white 69c
Belts. Webb 59c
Lockers, steel . . ... 4.95
Bunk Beds 2.50. 3.95 and 4 95
Shoes,Army field type 5.95
Show Cases.

Large size . . 42.50 and 47.50
Tool or Tackle Boxes 1.95 and 2.95
Paint Outside. White, gat... 2.93
Sun Glasses, Air Corps ... 5 95
Sun Glasses. Air Corps type 4 95
Musette Bags 65c
Blankets. O.D. . . 3 95 and 4 95
WAC Drerees 1 95
New Mosquito Nets 2.95
Pup Tentl 3.95
Canteen with cover . . . 65c
Cotton Pillows for cushions . . 75c
First Aid Kits 1.39

Tents, Cots. Tools, Camping and
Fishing Supplies

Try Us. We May Have It"
And Many Other Items

War Surplus Store
JACK ROBERTS, Ovitf

605 E 3rd Phone 2263

Inlaid Linoleum
Rubber Flooring
Formica Cabinets

Installed

Big Spring Paint

5c Paper

1701 Gregg Phone 1181

FOR SALE
49--A Miscellaneous

Compter
with IS

Attachments '59
SO EASY TO OPERATE

SO SANITARY

SO VERSATILE

SO COMPLETE

CLEANS EVERYTHING

FREE
TRIAL

IN
YOUR
HOME

PER
WEEK

204 - 208 Scurry

FOR SALE: Good new and used
copper radiators for popular makes
ears, trucks and pickups. Satisfac-
tion guaranteed. PEURXF07 RADI-
ATOR SERVICE. 901 East 3rd. St.
FARMERS. TRDCKERS Buy Tar-pauli-

at greatly reduced prices.
Army Surplus Store. 114 Main St
1946 "Vac" Case tractor with aster
and cultivator. It Is In excellent
condition. sUll like new: only farmed
150 acres: price J1600. Write Murray
Davidson, Gen. DeL. Garden

MODE O'DAY

95

EASY

Special on lot blouses.
Regular $2.98 and $3.98

While they last, only $1.98.
Get more for what you pay.

Save At Mode O'Day.
123 E. 3rd Phone 1665

Monogramming
And Stamping in colors, gold
and silver. Napkins, cards,
stationery, matches etc.

Immediate Delivery.

TheWhat Not Shop
210 E, Park Phone433

PLAYPEN for sale, see 900 Gregg.
Price S10. Used less than, three
months.
FOR SALE: Ft Worth Spudder
Model L with truck, tools and a
new ease motor priced to- - selL Phone
2391. 403 E. 6th St

KLEEN KOLD lee box for sale:
100 lb. capacity, good condition.
Phone 25E6--

FOR sale bargain: 21 jewel Ellin
railroad watch: beautiful Cabinet
Phllco radio. Phone 911.

YARD DIRT for sale: red eatclaw
sand or fill in dirt Phone 1645--

See'Us For Motorcycles.

Bicycles and Whizzer motors

for bicycles; parts and service.

A'so sharpen and repair any

make of lawn mowers.

Thixton's Cycle

Shop
908 W. Highway Phone 2144

RebuiltMotors
Give your old car new life.
Get a rebuilt motor from

Wards.
35 new parts, built to Wards

high Standards. For Ford A,
AA, V8, Chevrolet and Ply-mout-

Liberal allowance for
old motor.

Montgoremy Ward
and Company

221 W. 3rd.

WANTED TO BUY

50 Household Goods
FURNITURE wanted. We need used
furniture, give us a chance before
you seU. Get our prices befor oa
buy W. L. McCollsUr. 1001 W. 4th.
Phone 1261

WANT to buy. sell or trad new and
used furniture and stoves. BAMEY
FURNITURE. 1207 E. 3rd- -, across
from Coleman Camp.
54 Miscellaneous
WANTED: Clean
Herald Office.

Cotton rags at

WANTED Clean cotton rags. ShroyeJ
Motor Co. Phone 37.

WANT to buy'men's and boy cloth-
ing; luggage and shoes: used furni-
ture. Jim's Trading Post. BOS W
3rd. Street.

FOR RENT

60 Apartments

TERMS
$7.25

THREE room unfurnished apartment
for rent; H. M. Ralnbolt, Wagon
Wheel.

SMALL apartment for rent: adjoin-
ing bath; frigldalre: also bedroom.
close In, bills paid. Phone 1529. 605
Main.
ONE and two room furnished apart-
ments for couple only in duplex.
210 N Gregg.
THREE room furnishH apartment
for rent: duplex at rear of Plnlle's
Liauor Store, cousles only. 1428 E.
3rd.. Phone 2130.
FOR RENT One three room fur-
nished apartment: one two room
furnished apartment. 80S Main.
APARTMENTS for rent; Owl Tour-1s- t

Court. 1226 W 3rd.. Phone 9546.

TWO room furnished apartment for
rent; also two bedrooms. Phone
2360-- 110 Nolan.
PRIVATE living room, bedroom and
bath for rent: spacious closets; air
conditioned: for two people, pre-
ferably couple. Phone 2255.

TWO room furnished apartment for
rent, 500 Lancaster.

FOR RENT

63 Bedrooms
TEX HOTEL: data Ik trt park
Ins; air conditioned: weekly rate.
Phone 991. 501 E. 3rd. 8L
FRONT bedroom for rent: adjoin-
ing bath: on bra toe 424 D2.
NICE bedroom for rent; adjoining
bath: private entrance: dose In;
gentleman only. 310 Lancaster.
NICE front bedroa for renfc Utcb
en privileges: living rood privileges:
garage: adjoining bathr on bus Wg,
1605 State. Phone 182Z.
SOUTH bedroom for rent: prtrat
entrance; adjoining- bath. 1103

BEDROOM for .rest: 311 Grew.
Phone 33S before 9 a. m. or after
630 p. m. Men preferred.
BEDROOM for rest: private en-
trance; gangs. 1600 Nolan or pbeea
1496.

ROOM for rest; close In; Pbcb
1020--J or can at 404 Lancaster.
FRONT bedroom for rest: private
entrance to roots, and bats sad
telephone. 107 Z. 18th.
65 Houses
NICE unfurnished boose for rest;
no pets. dean.Call at 901 Lancaster.
NICE, modern three room furnished
bouse for rent. None refrigerator;
couple only. Phone 1129--

68 Business Property

FOR RENT

Downtown office space,street

level, near Courthouse a-- 1

Post Office.

J. T. Thornton, Jr
1004 Wood SL Phone 154

WANTED TO RENT
72 Houses
COUPLE wants to rent unfurnished
modern house or apartment Fhent
after, 1:00. Phone 2253--

'REAL ESTATE

LOANS
F. H. A. LOANS

T. H. A. - G. L

COMBINATION LOANS

CONVENTIONAL LOAN

COMMERCIAL LOANS

Worth Peeler

RITZnTHEATRE BLDO.

TEL. 2103

80 Houses For Sale
GOOD bOYS Cf REAL BTAT
3 Modern Or room hous ess)
batlu. a rood boy: locatad oa lost15th. St.
X Hie flvt room bora, and caUi.
near High School 09 pavement!
priced reasonable.
1. Six room duplex near High Seheal
oa pavement: priced reasonable.
8. Nice honsa and oath witagarage apartment oa Gregg Street
8. A beautiful come tn WashiarlMPlace, very modem.
9 Have soma real choice rtsldtae
lota: also several choice busts
Iota on South Gregg Street as4 est
3rd Street
1L Good grocery basin
location.
12. A rtal bur. good Bihrr
Laundry; doing a ale hnilnwi.
14-- Real Die two torr teda
DUUdlng rut oil of 3rd. tr.ngood buy
IS. Extra Special. 1M0 ten cfcafc- -
tuuca; sneep prod rne.
feactc two good wn u
lot oi water.
Win be glad to help yon ra lebor selling' your Real but.W U JONES. RIAL ESTATZ
501 E. 13th. Pbon lt24
FIVE room hottM with tn bath and
dralnboard. for sale by owner. Se
at 1011 Wood Street. Call 3670--

New Raneho type dwiniar la Part
Hill addition: ha six rooms, bath,
service room, caraga attached. Tw
bedrooms and den: lots of closets
and built in fixtures.
New tlv room house, bath. gar.
attached. Larg rooms. Park XII
addition.

Can Jim KeWhorter
Phone 923 or 779--J

J. B. COLLINS. Realtor
204 Runnels St.

PARK HILL ADDITION: JV H, A
borne, 700 W. 18th; corner lot. ex
cellent condition. See anytto '.be
for p. m.
NICE thre room hoes with bats
for sale; built tn cabinets: new hat
water heater. To be moved. Sec O.
E. Neely. 3 mile East of Toysan.
Golf OU Lease.

SPECIAL

17 acres close in; good
house,.good well water, light
and gas; priced for quick sale.
Close to town; barn and chick-
en houses, $4500. House and
lot on West Highway, $3,500.

PHONE 2676

Good place in Settles Height.
modern stucco; two rooms and bat!
on rear of lob rent for S30. tmaatki
good garage; career tot. trt.front, pric SS650 cash.
Four room noose and baUu fur-
nished: well located: vahiabla lot.
14500. $2500 down payment. 11 l-- T

acres, good bona and bars; erty
water, light and gu. S3300.
Good all hotel bslldlsc for J r
trad.
Six room house ta DaDa to trad
for Big Spring residence."
240 acre farm, half cultivation: toed
Improvements: electricity: tractar
and an necessary tools. S10S. ar
possession.
Real good brick venetr. cloM ta.
worth tn money.Three reatal salts.

J.B-- PICKLE

OWc Fnon 1217

ResidencyFnon 8013-7--3

Do you want a nice brick home
with five rooms? Priced to
sell. Call

E. J. BROOKS, 2454--W

or
W. X. JONES, 1273--W

FOR SALE. S4.40O. first mortcag
notes on country property located
near Big Spring, bearing 8 per cent
interest. Win sell at discount. Writ
Post Ofllca Box Til. Six aferifiz,
Texas.



JtEAL ESTATE

m Hewsea for Sale- -

X. TesrTsea swfitro has.esAir
let la WaaMatoa Flae. SSUMO. Sean
Co-r- parzcst.
X Fee; reoa boom. 1 lot, am
caoel. SXBOO.

3. Poor roots house, bath and ta-ra- se.

two corner lots, dose tn near
acbool 3i00fti
4. Business location. aASoSstnt "ret-ra- n

hoapital: lot 200 x 300 ft. Ideal
location ftr tourist cciut or ay
ktad of business,
&. Tees rooa rock hoaa. four lot.
Sontbeastpart of town. $4,000.
6. Good fonr rooa honse and oath
ea. hltSrway 8a lot 50 x 120 tt
Sood kC7. S3750.
V. Mr raos reralxhed home; alee
ftc atew to aehool: wands
vasaa frsn tow a.
8. Brleh dcples, caraxe apartaest.
dose ta ea pareaeat. priced to aell

9 T1" rooa hocse wita bad.
don is. dose to tctiool.
1L Tliiee extra tood lots. East frost
lots oa Settles At. S300. each.
14. Tin rooa bene oa three a1
treat eraer lots, close in.
X. fire 'room bote, bath and car-ac-e:

tn rooaj apartaesbSettlea
461tic.

XT Fir rooa home, rarac ana
erser tot: Sichlasd Part. IT Too

vast ea of the better boats, a
tfcl one.

Let a eta too with resr leal
but seeds, bcrtac or sH1nt--

W.. R. TAXES
Pbes 2S41--W

7C5 Johasoa
OOOO T"Tf secUea tana. v3 ssv

vrored. in Marts Cozntj.
Kt room, how and tfle bath, eor-B-et

lot. veil Undseasrd. pared
street located ia Edvards BtltU.
Ttr rooa hocit and batn. located
en paTed street, veil Uadseaped.
aaaU dova paracat.paracots lire
rent.
Ttn rooa brick resteer. doaaJ sar-ax-e-

dose to school, larce CI tos
ea house aov at 4 percent Interest.
Sereralrood tots to ball a hea oa.

WOBTH PSEtlB
phone m 32S slant

SPECIAL

Nice Ave room bouse' and
bath; Park Hill addition; very
nice; extragood price for next
few days. Owner leaving town.

W. M. Jones

Phone 1822 501 E. 15th

Here is a good Investment a
good place cjose In; several
rooiasj good rental property;
worth the money.
GOOD the room house and
garage; cornerlot, 3 blocks of
High School, $7,500.

J. B. Pickle
Phone 1217

CWX tvo rooa house and bathjter
sl to b acredell lot. Fhoa 9005
yva far appoataent.
For sal or trade: 1937 Xnterastloaal
sjcboel Bcs cumerted lato borne
partly rnmished. Oa hishvay 80 ro
teg West near Ace of Cabs.
"XX nous for sal famlsne--room
or unfurnished la WaihlastonPlac.
rhoo 646.

Five room brick home, well
located. 100 x 140 ft. close In
en Gregg St

Five room stucco house,
furnishedand two lots on San
Antonio St.

Four room rock house, 8
acres, tome orchard, in Clyde,
Texas.

If you want to buy or sell,
SEE

DEE PURSER
1504 Bunnels, Phone 197

- FOR SALE

Nice, new home, just com-

pleted; inside city limits; ap-

proximately two acres in water
district; 400 barrel waterstor-
age tank; also threeouthouses;

good buy and priced to sell.

R. B. REEDER
Realtor

504 Scurry Phone531

TWO bedroom boas for sale: Or
ntrrmi tarnished er unfurnished;
pared street. Pica XS05--W after
9 m. or Saterday aad Suaday.

VIVE rooa house vfth bath aad
untr rooa: reaetlan WTnrts. fur-

nace, landscaped. lam rarax. T.
H. A. loan: vin seS femisheder

1300 Wood Street.
KVE rooa fraae house for tale to
be aoTtd; has bath and Hints:
veatber beard outside, ship-la- p and
sheet-roc-k Inside. Good paper ea
vans, located Northwest of ton.
Priced SL5O0. See E L. Suaacaa.
4 1--2 afles SosUtvest of town. Joia-la- s:

Airport Field.
Bouses For Sale

Six rooa modern, sev hocse. lo-

cated oa W. 17th Street.
Six rooa house oa Srcaaore 8t
aear footban park.
Rn reoaModern house. 1100 Block.
East X3th St.
Three rooa house aad hath ea
Kortb Side.
Larrc apartaestbouse, fumiihtd.
near Eish School.
tarce apartment, four lots oa cor-
ner, four carases.
Ten rooms, excellent condition,
pared streets, four blocks frea Vet-
eran Hospital: priced at bartaia.
Lara am rooa house, three lots
oa corner, double carase. serrants
bouse, sood condition, worth th
Burner, pared street. FIT blocks
from easiness district.

Business Property
Sereral lots on South Greer Street.
Business lot oa West Third Street.
Businesslot en corner of EastFourth
Street.
Three lots 6a corner Tast Second8t.
Tvo business lots ia Heart of Busi-
ness. District.
Business lot close in oa Runnels St.
Business lots on I.anesa Hlshvay.

See or can
JOSEPH EDWARDS
as FetroleaaBids.

Say Phone 93) Klsht S00

Going downtown tailor
shop; paying big; will sell
reasonablebecause ofowner's
health.

Motor Court with grocery
store on Highway 80, Big
Spring, making big money;
will sell at half price, because
of owner's health.

RubeS. Martin
PHONE 642

Classified Advertising
REAL ESTATE

flvHouses For Sale

McDonald
-- "

. Robinson '

Realty Company

711 Main Phone 2678

SIX room bouse on Washing-
ton Blvd.

NICE Trailer bouse for sale;
goodcondition.
Nice home on Scurry

Street, corner lot
Five room horns on Wood

Street; practically new.
Some nice homes In Ed-

wards Heights.
Six room home, close in,

sear school, vacant
Businessand residence lots.
Some choice apartment and

rooming houses.
5 acres,well improve!, good

house.
North front lot in Edwards

Heights.
Nice home on 11th Place;

immediate possession.
Brick home on Goliad.

FOR SALE

Four room bouse and bath;
two good lots, well located on
West4th, $3,250 cash.

Three room house andbath,
good house on West 4th, $2,-50-0.

2Vi acres at East end of
6th Street; outside city, $750.

J. B. Pickle
PHONE 1217

SPECIAL

Grocery Store, stock and fix-

tures; would trade for house
in good part of town. About
$5,500; nice place located in
brick building.

C. E. Read
PHONE 169--W

Extra Good Buy

Very pretty brick duplex. Four
rooms and bath each side.

Nice duplex, three
rooms and bath each side.

These buildings on 2 1-- 3 lots;
very best location on bus line
and pavement

W. M. Jones

Phone 1822 501 E. 15th

SPECIAL BT OWNER
Edvards Btlsats

Prr rooa fraa hoot, plus break-
fast rooa: til bath and kttehea.
Floor furnace; soft vater: Karat;
earner lot: pareaent: ale lava:
shrubbery aad trees. Phone UR5.J.

80 acre farm on Lamesa
Highway, about three miles
out; fine land, good well.

H?lf section farm about 15
miles North and West, Big
Spring; nice home, good well
and milL Most all in culti-

vation; level land and as good
as the best

15 acres close to Ellis,
Homes, can get well water,
price $2,250.

Fine sectonon pavement; in-

exhaustible water and good,
fair Improvements. Close
enough to live on place and
work in Big Spring.

New building on Highway
80; 30x40 ft Lot 50x150 ft;
partly financed; possessionIn
short time.

Duplex and large home
nearVeteran'iHospital; owner
want to sell it Buyer can
assumelarge loan. Possession.--

Lovely five room brick
home with double garage; G:

L financed, $2,400 cash; bal-

ance easy monthly payments,
vacant now.

Duplex and garage apart-
ment; located on Dallas
Street; good income and good

place to live; price and terms
as you would like it

NEW frame house in Wash-

ington Place; just off Blvd.;
built in garage; now about
ready to occupy, already
financed.
RUBES. MARTIN

PHONE 642
Office, 1st National Bank Bldg.

Extra Special
This large five room home

in Edwars Heights, paved
street;on bus line, completely
furnished from piano to lawn
mower; including living room
suite, two bedroom suits,
frigidaire, "kitchen range,
washing machine, air condi-

tioner, dinete set, heating
stoves. This house Is worth
$8,500, furnishings $8,375.

A. P CLAYTON
Real Estate

Phone254 800 Gregg St

SIX rooa new house with bath for
sale: utility rooa and attached ta-
rase; tertone vails; hardvood
floors: all rooms laree and veU
arranged. Plenty of closets. Imme-
diate possession.F. H. A. loan. Lo-

cated 70 W. 17th, Inquir Lantlsy
JUU Lumbar Co. J

REAL ESTATE
80 Houses For Sale

LISTINGS

1. Six room house and bath
on West 17th Streetfor $9,-50-0.

2. Five rooms and bath at the
low price of $4500, one-ha- lf

cash andterms.
3. Five rooms and bath, close

In, only $7,500. The lot is
worth half.

4. 640 acres of good mixed
, land, all ready to plant, $60

an acre.
5. Forty acres of good mixed

land within one mile of
Stanton. Six room bouse,
good water, barn and ga
rage all equipped with bu-to-ne

and R.E.A., for only
. $6,500 cash.
6. Several tourllt--our-ts for

sale, business and resldehT
lots, and other listings not
down. If Interested in real
estate, see me first

7. Some good buys In apart-
ment houses.

8. Five unit apartmenthouse,
must sell becauseof health;
good Investment; Call or
seeme.

9. Four room house and two
. lots, $2,000. Cornor lot, 100

ft on Gregg Street 50 ft
deep.

J. W. ELROD

110 Runnels Phone 1635

Night Phone 17B4--J

SPECIALS

1. Six room house on Goliad
Street

2. Nine room home-o- n Scur-
ry Street, 2 blocks from Post
Office.

3. Duplex on Scurry Street,
8 rooms, 2 baths, modern.

4. Rock home, 5 rooms and
two lots, close to new hospital
in Edwards Heights.

5. Brick vener home on
Washington Blvd.;
priced reasonable;

6. 15 other houses and
hnmpt. dimlexes. hotel, tourist
courts and several brick busi-

ness buildings.
7. Lot In Edwards Heignts,

also Park Hill, home in
Dot-I- t Will AririiHnn

8. All kinds real estate,
farms and ranches.

C. E. READ

503 Main Phone 169--

FOUR room house for sal to b
moTed. 100 W. Benton. Phone 142--

NEW four room house vlth attached
Karate, bath, built in cabinet; hard-
vood floors; tood location. F. H. A.
loan; immediate possession.Located
1022 Stadium Are. Inquire Lantler
Hall Lumber Co.

81 Lots and Acreage
FOR SALE: NIc bulldlnt lob Ed-

vards Hcithts, lmmidlstolx In rear
of BU HllUld Drlre. 80 x HO ft.
S600. Box L. R. U. e--o Herald.

82 Farms and Ranches

SPECIAL

Worth the money, nice little
farm. 162 1--2 acres, 5 miles
North Big Spring, Just off
paved highway. Minerals
worth price you pay for land.
Well improved.

"W. M. Jones
Phone 1822 501 E. 15th

EXTRA SPECIAL
Choice ranch, 1280 acres with
sheep proof fence and cross
fence; near Garden City. This
ranch is in Irrigation water
district Two good wells and
windmills. You can buy this
worth the money.

W. M. Jones
PHONE 1822

501 East 15th Street

SHEEP.and cattle ranches In
Colorado, $11, $16, $20, up to
$40. per acre?leased land with
these ranches.
Here is one in south central
Colorado; good six room
bouse; other improvments,
well watered, 125 acre hay
meadow, 3800 acres owned,
3400 leased, canaclty said to
be 2000 sheep, $55,000 deeded
land, leased assigned, plenty
of moisture.

J. B. PICKLE
PHONE 1217

83 BusinessProperty

DRUG STORE

For Sale

Stock and fixtures at Invoice.
Making plenty of money.

Owner must sell becauseof
Health.

Rube S. Martin
PHONE 642

SMALL business, tood location, do-l-nc

tood business, mustsell by April
12. Hippy Hour Cafe, 1109 W. 3rd.
BUILDING. 24 X 60 ft. for sale on
nice locaUon. See 207 Younz St.
FOR SALE: Beauty Shop, ooine
tood business; three room apart-
ment; furnished. Consider sood Ford
or Chevrolet trsde In. S27S0. Oran-fall- s.

Texas. C. W Slsson, Phon
110-- Monahans, Texas.

kAL --ESTATE

fiSBusiness Property

SPECIAL
Downtown cafe, best equip-

ped; doing good business;good
lease and fair rent; for sale
surprisingly cheap. Can sell
beer. If interestedat all see
this.

Rube S. Martin
PHONE 642

86 Miscellaneous
FOR sale or trade in Stanton on
highway 80. Karate, 30 x 50 feet:
price 36.000. Will sell outrltht or
trade for house in Bit Sprlns. See
BUlle Rhodes. Neel's Sweet Shop.
Bit Sprint.

Politcial Calendar"
The Herald is auUjprKed to

announce thefoHowing
office, subject

to action of the Democratic
primaries.
For State Senator:

KILMER B. CORBIN
(Dawson County)

STERLING J. PARRISH
(Lubbock County)

DUDLEY K. BRUMMETT
(Lubbock County)

RALPH BROCK
For District Attorney:

MARTELLE McDONALD
For District Clerk:

GEORGE CHOATE
For 'County Judge:

WALTON MORRISON
For County Attorney:

GEORGE T. THOMAS
For County Clerk:

LEE PORTER
For County Sheriff:

TRAVIS REED
R. L. (BOB) WOLF
JESS SLAUGHTER
A. D. BRYAN

For Tax Assessor-Collecto- r:

R. B. HOOD
B. E. (Bcrnie) FREEMAN
JOHN F. WOLCOTT

For County Treasurer:
MRS. IDA COLLINS

For Co. Commissioner Pet. 1:
W. W. (Walter) LONG
H. B. (Happy) HATCH
FRANK HODNETT

For Co. Commissioner Pet. 2:
G. E. (RED) GILLIAM
TOMMY HUTTO

For Co. Commissioner,Pet. 3:
R. L. (PANCHO)'NALL
GROVER BLISSARD
NELL BARNABY

For Co. Commissioner, Pet 4:
WALTER GRICE
EARL HULL
CECIL (CY) NABORS "

J. E. (JOHN) NORRIS
J. E. UNDERWOOD

For Justice of Peace,Pet. 1:

W. O. (OREN) LEONARD
For Constable,Pet. 1:

J. T. THORNTON
J. F. (Jim) CRENSHAW
M. H. (Shorty) GRIMES

For County Surveyor:
RALPH BAKER

BATTirtm at Johnny Griffin's.

ST. AUGUSTINE

GRASS

Vineyard Nursery
LANDSCAPING

Phone 1888

1705 Scurry

Frigidaire

Appliances

Taylor Electric
Company

Phone2408 & 1015
212 East3rd

Livestock Sale
Every Wednesday

T&P STOCKYARDS
BIG SPRING LIVESTOCK

AUCTION CO&EPANY

A. L. Cooper and John Poe
Owners

Ob Air 1:15 to 1:30 P. M.
Each Wednesday

SalesBegins 12 Noon

St. Augustine

GRASS
Per 27cSquare

EASON ACRES
NURSERY

6 Miles East on Highway 80

COFFEE
and

COFFL--E
AttorneyS-At-- Law

General Practice In All
Courts

LESTER FISHER BLDG.
SUITE 215-16-- 17

PHONE 501

Two Youths Sought
After Cab Hold-U- p

Police today were searching for
two young men, who were said to
have held up a taxi driver and
made off with his cab, cash and
watch.

Jim Fite, City Cab driver, re-

ported to police that two men, ap-

proximately 20 years of age, held
him up at 3:30 p. m. Thursday at
100 E. 7th, took about $25 to $30

in cash, then relieved him of his
watch and the cab.

The cab was found abandon
at 400 E. 5th by police not Iflhg
after Fite sounded the alar:

No trace of the two youths had
been found to noonFfiday, how
ever.

hree Midshipmen
Killed In Crash

CROWLEY. La., April 9. Ml

Three Navy midshipmen were
killed and a fourth was injured
last night in the crash of a priva-

tely-owned plane in the Louis-
iana coastal marshesjust south
of the town of Pecan Island.

O'Brien Twins Land
Cpls. Richard and Robert

O'Brien, twin sons of Dr. and Mrs.
P. D. 0'Brien disembarked at San
Francisco, Calif. Thursday after
noon after serving more than 15
months in Japan with the army.
Mrs. O'Brien, accompaniedby her
daughter, Mrs. Marie Haynes, met
the boys in San Francisco andwill
bring them home following their
discharge Saturday afternoon.

WeatherForecast
Dept of Commerce Weather

Bureau

EAST TEXAS: Partly cldudy this aft-
ernoon, tonlsnt and Baturdny bcutterfd
showers In extreme south portion 'his
afternoon Warmer north portion Satur-
day. Moderate wouthet winds oti coast.

WEST TEXAS Fair this affrpoon and
tonleht Not so cold In Panhandle pnd
South Plains tonight. Saturday partly
cloudy and warmer

BIO SPRING AND VICINITY' Fair
this afternoon and tonlt;ht Not so cold
tonight. Saturday. Partly cloudy and
warmer.

Hlsh today 78. low tonight 32. high
tomorrow 85

Highest temperature this date. 95 In
1930. lowest this date. 23 In 1914; maxi-
mum rainfall this date 71 In 1910.

TEMPERATURLS
CITY Max Mm

Abilene 80 50
Amarlllo 65 34
BIO SPRING 7fl 46
Chicago 50 19
Denver G2 32
El Paso 82 52
Port Worth 75 6
Oalveston 79 70
New York 55 48
St. Louis 65 39
Sun sets today at 7 11 p. m., rises

Saturday at 6 24 a m.

HARD OF HEARING
SONOTONE VThSSZ

Personally Helps You!
JOHN W. TAUL. Bier.

Phone 1275-- J

JAMES
LITTLE

ATTORNEY-AT-LA- W

StateNatl Bank Bldg.
Phone393

SSiSSSSSSSSSSSSSSH
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American Life Is

Lauded By Gross
Speaking on the theme "Amer

ica, Land of the Free," Carl Gross
told members of the American
Busines club at noon Friday that
Americanism is the only form of
existing government enabling the
citizen to chart his own life.

In sketching the magnificence of

our nation, Grossstated that Amer
icans are the bestfed, besthoused,
and best clothed people in the
world. The Stateshave never been
defeated in six wars; the nation
was fostered by a declaration of

unlimited freedom during center-ie- s

when no such freedom was
known in the world. The success
of the country in its self-assur- ed

type of government is attributed
to the free enterprise, bountiful
initiative and natural resources.

Thus, concluded Gross, the load
of leadership of the world falls to
the United States because of our
great influence. Our highly envious
position must be protected by
arms.Only the principles of equal-
ity, liberty and justice can uphold
our hopes of world peace and co
operation.

In regularbusinessportion of the
meeting Doug Orme announced a
proposed mejger of several na-

tional clubs the ABC included
into one club in order to increase
membership and influence. This
question will come up for voting
at the national convention in June.
Samples for the club's shirt order
were shown.

Markets
WALL STREET

NEW YORK. April 9. fV-T- he stock
market had to contend with further
profit cashing today and moderate Ir-
regularity was th result.

Professionals Inclined to trim accounts
on the Idea that a technical correction
of the substantial recovery was overdue
The coal mine impasse. threatening
transportation and widespread industries.
remained as a bearish Influence.

The outlook for big defense spending
again served as a prop for Issues of
companies that may benefit

Dealings were fairly active from the
start. The direction was somewhat focty
near midday.
LIVESTOCK

FORT WORTH. April 9. W CATTIE
250; calves loo: generally steady; all
classes In meager supply: odd head and
small lots medium to good feed yearlings
Z3.00-2- 7 00; common and medium cows
17 00-2- 0 00; canners and cutter? 10 00--
16 50: few common to good slaughter
calves 17.00-2- 7 00: cull calves 11C0-1-7 00:
choice calves and bulls and stoekers
scarce.

HOGS 400: butcher cots steady-- to
mostly 50c lower: sows steady to 50c
down: stocker pigs unchanged; too 21.50
paid sparingly, most good and choice
1B0-Z7- 0 id. butcher 21.00; iood and choice
275-40- 0 lb. butchers 16.00-20.7- good and
choice 150-17- 5 lb 17 50-2- 0 75: sows mostly
15.00, a few to 15.50; atocer pigs 17 00
down.

SHEEP 1.600 killing rlasse steady;
no good spring lambs; feeders scarce;
medium grade spring lambs 21.00 don;
medium and good shorn lambs 18.00-2- 0 50,
latter price buying No. 1 pelts; cull and
common wooled slaughter ewes 9.50-i- n CO;

cull and common shorn ees 7.00-- JO.
COTTON

NEW YORK. April 9. (JT N00.1 cotton
prices were 45 cents a bale lower to
35 cents higher than the previous close.
May 36.67. July 35 05. and Oct. 32.47.
LOCAL MARKETS

No 2 Miio S3 2 cwt. ron nir Spring.
No 2 Kaffir and mixed grains 13 20 cwt.

Eggs candled 36 cents a doten, cash
market cream 80 cents lb.; hem 32
cents lb.

Public Records
Derrel Dempsey Douglass, Jr.. and

Melba Dean Anderson, Big Spring.
Warranty Deeds

John Whltaker it ui to C. M. Cochran
et ux. Lots 1. 2. Whltaker add. 60O.

C. H. UcDaniel et ux to O. R. Sim-
mons et ux. Lot 1 W 20'. Lot 3, Blk
38. add. S750.

L. G. Grantham to James L. Cooper.
Lots 1. 2. Blk 18. Coahoma, tl.500.

Joe J. Gilmer et ux to J. H. Mer-wort- h.

Lot 5. Blk 10. McDoweU Hts.
add. S5.591 55.

Ora Todd to Cecil Todd. Lot 1, Blk
6, add. tl.100.

John R. Chaney et ux to Lewis V.
Jorsensen et ux, N 50' W-- 2. Blk 26. Col-
lege Hts add. S7.250.

Samuel Frank Becker et ux to D. O.
Hart et ux. Lot 3. Blk 33, Boydstun's
add. S3.500
In 70th District Court

Bestrlce H Kansdy vs Robert Kanady.
suit for divorce.

Edith Kupper rs Tracy Le Kupper.
suit for divorce.

Thelma Wood vs Heston Wood, suit
lor dlvorc.

Juanita Eugenia Newton vs Arthur
James Newton, suit for dlvorc.
New Vthlelts

Mead's Fine Bread. Chevrolet pickup.
Lewis Christian, Chevrolet truck.

SATURDAY ONLY

Color Magic

in SHEER NYLONS

The new stocking colors look so different from the
"sun-tans- " of last year! They're exciting, and smart

with the new dress shades.

Colors: Mistique M Art
Black Beauty Pair P'.W

FIRST QUALITY

FISHERMAN'S
PRICES TALK

Big Spring (Texas) Herald,

Sterling Test

Hits Sa f Wafer
Anderson-Prichar-d and Vickers

No. 1 Foster, southeast Sterling
county wildcat, had a hole full of
salty, sulphur water in a drillstem
test in the top of the Ellenburger.

The test was from 8,200-3-0 feet
and operators plan to plug back to
approximately 4,400 feet to try to
complete from the Wichita-Alban-y

of the lower Permian, where the
wildcat had flowed at the rate of
691 barrelsper day on an extended
test

On the test in the Ellenburger,
the tool was open two hours. There
was a strong blow of air through-
out and gas showedat the surface
in one hour and 35 minutes. The
top two sands of drill pipe were
filled with drilling mud. and the
remainderof the string was full of
salty, sulphurwater, with extreme-
ly light shows of oil and gas. Lo-

cation is 660 feet out of the south
eastcorner of section 12-1- 5, H&TC.

Sun No. 3 J. W. Arledge was
announcedin Coke county as a

south stepout from the
same company's No. 1 Arledge,
discovery wen for flowing produc-
tion from the Marble Falls lime
to open the Arledge field in the
north-centr- al part of the county.

The new exploration will be 660
feet frdtn the south and1,980 feet
from the west lines of section 261-Blo- ck

1-- A, H&&TC. It Is to start
at once and go about 6 750 feet to
test the Marble Falls.

Sun No. 1 Central National bank
of San Angelo, trustee, 1,320 feet
southwestof the discovery for flow-
ing production in the Crinoidal reef
lime of the Pennsylvanlan In the
south Jameson field id Northwest
Coke county, was bottomed at 7,-2- 18

in the Ellenburger, taking a
drillstem test.

The Ellenburger was entered at
7,193 feet and the test was run at
7,193-7,20-7 with the tool open one
hour. There was a slight blow of
air for part of the period and
recovery was five feet of drilling
mud, with no shows of oil or gas
rr water. The project drilled 15 feet
deeper and is to test again.

AAF Vets To Hove
SpecialChanceFor
New Enlistment

Veterans with service In one of
the Armed Forces since May 12,
1945, now have the special chance'
to enlist for a minimum of three
years with the famed 7th Infantry
Regimental Combat team, a com-
ponent of the 3rd Infantry Divi-
sion, according to information re-

ceived by the local U. S. Army
recruiting station.

This unit, which is about to be
transferredfrom Camp Campbell,
Ky to Fort Benning, Ga., carries
a record of 531 days of combat
against the Nazis in North Africa,
Sicily, Italy, France, hnd Germany
during World War II.

Girl's and
Boys7

Ladies' and .Q

&
4

Fri, April 9, 1948

Injunction Givtn

In Radio Dispute
Judge Cecil Colllngs Thursday en

tered a permanentinjunction cru-

der restraining Southwestern and
Ector County broadcasting com-
pany stations from broadcasting
athletic events on Fly Field.

The 70th court order grew out el
a temporaryorder entered follow
ing a bearing in the court oa as
application injunction brought by
the Oil Center Broadcasting com-
pany, which holds a contractwith
the school board for broadcasting
right from the local stadium.

The other two stations appealed
from the temporary restrainingor-

der, but the court of civil appeals
in El Paso sustained the trial
court, and then the supreme court
declined to grant a writ of error.
Entry of the permanentorder then
followed.

DIVORCE GRANTED
Albert Bob Strother won a di-

vorce decree fromHesterStrother
in a caseheardby JudgeCecil C.
Colllngs In 70th district court this
morning.

PARK INN
Specializing Is

GoodSteate
DINE aad DANCE

Estrascato Cfty Park

MEET
Your Friends At

West Texas
Bowling Center

Instructors On Duty At
AD Times

Wed. NIrht - Ladle Leaxv
Thurs. Nleht - 3 Maa Lea
314 Runnel Ph. 9529

EEsTjk4S&

On "TV
AD Makes

Motor Tnse-U-p

Brake Service
General Repair
Acetyleneaad

Electric Welding

Dub's Garage
2109 Scarry .. Ffcew 1571

39c each

and 59ceach

Percale

Mexican Straw

HATS

Your Friendly 5 & 10

LADIES'

APRONS
80 Square

Half or Bib Style

67
MeCrory's

Your Friendly5 & 10

i. each
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ANDY DEVINE
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Drive-I- n Theatre
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State Solon Hits
Tidelands Ruling

COMMERCE, April 9. IB The
U. S. Supreme Court's decision in
the California tidelands case vio
lated every principle of law for-

mulated in this country since the
Declaration of Independence,State
Senator G. C. Morris, Greenville,
assertedhere.

He said the decision gave the
government the right to procure
minerals without paying the own-
er.

BUY AN RCA VICTOR
And You Have No

Regrets

THE RECORD SHOP
Phone 230

PHONE 633
FREE DELIVERY

SABIPSON'S GROCERY
N

1401 Austin

Try The

CASINO CLUB

For Those

Delicious Steaks
Cut and PreparedAs

You Like Them By

Aubrey Howard
Open 6 Days A Week

Closed Monday
Phone 9581

MIIe E. On Hwy. 80

Chrysler- Plymouth Sales- Service
Factory Trained Mechanics, All Types of Mechanclal Work.
Washing and Greasing. Motor and Chassis Steam Cleaning.
Bear Front End Aligning Equipment, Wheel Balancing Equip-
ment. Expert Body Repairs.
Fan line of Genuine Chrysler and Plymouth Parts. See oar
Service Managerfor an estimate on an type of work, both large

MARVIN HULL MOTOR CO.
W. N. (BOD HUDDLESTON Partsand Service Manager

207 GOLIAD PHONE 59
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GRIM BUT OPTIMISTIC

Chiang Promises
Victory Over Reds

NANKING. April 9. UD Chiang
Kai-She-k said today seven of his
best divisions were destroyed in
Manchuria but declared defiantly
the Communists cannot conquer
China.

In one of the frankest public
speeches of his long career as
China's leader, the generalissimo
told the national assembly:

"I confess seven of the govern
ment's best division were de
stroyed in Manchuria. They were
my best armies that under my
command accomplishedthe revo-
lutionary campaigns with glory."

These divisions are being re-

organized, Chiang said, adding:
"I refuse to admit defeat because
our fighting strength is still power-
ful."

(Chiang evidently meant the di-

visions were destroyed over a con-

siderable period of time. There
has been no recent heavy fighting
in Manchuria.)

Chiang spoke deliberately and
seriously. The assemblymen, in
deference to his serious mood,
withheld applause. He made no
mention of the presidency, which

PHILIPPINE MEMORIES

General Returns
To Victory Scene

BATAAN-- , April 9. UR A husky,
two-st-ar general stepped out of
the jeep, took a calculating look,
and swung his machete at a stran-
gle of undergrowth. Then he

i scrambled up an eight foot em'

Sen. O'Daniel Pegs
Howard ERP Share
At Six Millions

The government's European re
covery program will cost Howard
county taxpayers, $6,551,879, ac-

cording to Sen. W. Lee O'Daniel.
Sen. O'Daniel, who frequently

has criticized the administration
policies, both domestic and foreign,
charged that the "give away Eu-

ropean recovery program will cost

Texas taxpayers $2,002,323,164.

These figures were supplied the
senator by the congressional li-

brary upon bis request for total
cost of the program from July 1,
1945 to June 30, 1947, plus the Mar-
shall (ERP) plan.

From the end of World War II,
the senator quoted, the per capita
cost has been$183, which would
figure out $3,841,800 for this coun-
ty. Based on $129.11 per capita, he
estimated the Marshall Plan cost
at $2,710,019.

The senator rapped the program
on the grounds that a third of the
ultimate total was earmarkedfor
England and that in (urn she was
trying to work out a trade agree-
ment with Russia.

Service Citations
Given ScoutLeaders

FORT WORTH, AprU 9. (0
"The material for a better world
and a free world" is contained In
scouting, the national president of
the Boy Scouts of America de-

clared here.
"We will come much closer to

the realiaztion of the world we
all would like to live in if we
could carry over the principles of
scouting into adulthood," Amory
Houghton, Corning, N. Y., said
last night.

Houghton spoke at a banquet in
which six distinguished service ci-

tations were given scout leaders
in the Southwest.

The banquet highlighted a meet-
ing of scout leaders in Region
Nine.

PeteLayden Hits
Hard For Browns

DALLAS. April 9 W Pete Lay-den- 's

heavy bat continues to play
an important role In the St. Louis
Brown's offense. The former Tex
as football star tripled home three
runs yesterday as the Browns
whipped the,ChicagoCubs,
victory gave the American Lea
guers an 8-- 4 edge in their scries
with the Cubs which ends with
today's game.

h f o cj ie&

"That wolf can't impress me with
that car! My boyiriend takes me
out in a Yellow Cab!"

Phone150
FOR A YELLOW CAB

All cabs radio controlled to make
service to you earlier.

hp says he wants to turn over to
someone else.

"In North China." lie said, "our
strength under Gen. Fu Tso-- is
growing. I guarantee within six
months to annihilate all Commun-
ists below the Yellow River (in
Central China.)" '

Conceding "we have made ser-
ious military mistakes," Chiang
said his armies are changing strat-
egy. No longer will they try to
defend all points, but will con-

centrate for decisive blows. As he
phrased it. the new strategy is
one of "big eat little."

He promised, however, to de-

fend not only Central and North
China but Manchuria as well, vow-
ing: "In 30 years or 60 years the
Reds will not conquer China."

On the subject of inflation, the
generalissimo declared China is
solvent. He said China has enough
gold, silver, other assets and U.
S. dollar credits to recall all of
the Chinesecurrency afloat.

Chiang said that now, with $463
million in assistancefrom the Unit-
ed States, "the prospects of eco-

nomic life arc brighter than ever."

bankment,
"If I'm right, the entrenchments

would be about in here," he said.
"This was our final line of resis-

tance."
The rest of the erouo crowded

up the embankment. There we
found the foxholes of Bataan, all
but burled now by the rank jungle
growth.

Six yearsago today 90.000 Amer-
ican and Filipino soldiers and
civilians emaciated, malaria-ridde- n

and battle-fagge- d climbed
out of holes like these all the way
across the Bataan peninsula. Re-

sistance was at an end.
Among them was this same ma

jor general, Albert M. Jones, now
neaa ot we u. s. Joint Military
Advisory Group to the Philippines.
He had walked then the only of-

ficer of his rank to do so in what
history calls the death march.

We traced eight or nine miles
of front line entrenchmentsas they
crisscrossed the Pilar to Bagac
road. That road was the dividing
line between Japaneseand Amer
ican-- mpino forces.

Jones had a snecific obioctlve.
He was looking for a pocket where
a regiment of Japanesehad been
encircled a half-mil- e inside the
American front lines.

Here Filipino troops, led by
Jones, won their first victory of
the campaign over Japanesereg-
ulars. They annihilated the Jap-
anese In desperate fighting from
Jan. 27 to Feb. 12, 1942. The vic-
tory was obscured in the bitter-
ness of the overwhelming defeat
a few weeks later.

We found where the Japanese
had dug themselves in.

"We were woefully short of mor
tar ammunition and most of what
we had were duds," Jones said.
"We had practically no hand Gre
nades. The jungle was so dense
you couldn't see more than 25
yards.

"This was our home, where we
lived and fought and died. . ."

Jones laughed bitterly.
Then our little nrnrpsslnn nt

jeeps drove away, leaving the his-
toric battlefield to Bataan's jun-
gleand the dust.

CALL FOR A
DEMONSTRATION

REX-AI- R

Greatest Invention
Since The Auto

Phone 2652--J
For Appointment

Tom A. Coffee
FRANCHISED DEALER

DoesYour DoorSag

Gjf&utaA
DOOR HOOD

i JTrTT

ypvl:
H

Dn
Your fronr door sefs the pal-ter- n

for your home. Is Ft invit-

ing or does it stand exposed?

THORP
PAINT STORE

311 Runnels Phone 56

BOGOTA MEETS

Resolution

Against Reds

Bogs Down
BOGOTA, Colombia, April 9, Ml

The Pan American Conference
bogged down today In its efforts to

obtain unanimous support of a re-

solution against communism.
A Chileansourcesaid Chile plans

to ask the American nations next
week to approve her anti-Re- d

resolution, even if there Is no;
Unanimity.

Last week Chile distributed
imonR the delegates a draft call-
ing for condemnation of what it
termed foreign-inspire- d subversive
activilites. Chile asked the Pan
American delegates to suggest
changes they might deem neces
sary.

The Chilean source said the re-

solution had not been submitted to
the conference becauseefforts
still are being made to achieve un
animous approval in advance.
Some nations have opposedbring
ing the matter before the parley
unlessassuranceof such unanimity
is obtained.

Further, the Chilean informant
said Mexico and Venezuelahad not
decided whether they will support
the resolution in the form it has
beensuggestedby Chile.

The two nations are reported to
oppose the conference directing
individual governments on what
action to take against communism.

Must Aid Child
In New Zealand

WICHITA FALLS, April 9. ffl- -A
Wichita Falls father was order-

ed yesterday to contribute to the
support of his daughter,
now living with her mother in
New Zealand.

District Judge H. W. Fillmore
reduced weekly payments to 55,
but said they must be made, even
though the child and mother re-

side in a foreign country.
The former war bride had writ-

ten the Judge she hadnot received
support payments of S10 weekly
previously ordered by the court
in a divorce settlement.

WesternersPlay

Oilers At 5:30
Big Spring's baseball Westerners

move to Forsap this afternoon to
engage in a seven-innin- g skirmish
with that community's Oilers. Both
teams are members of the Tri-Coun- ty

baseball league. Game
time is 5:30 p. m.

The Westerners have been en-

gaging in regulardrills under Man-
ager Eddie Hammond on a newly
cleared Bombardier school dia-

mond west of town.
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Killed In Mishap
LUBBOCK, April 9. OR Mrs.

Albert Wayland Hilliard, 40. Lyn-woo-d,

Calif.,' was killed in an
automobile accident near here
yesterday when a tire blew out.

HIGHWAY

PACKAGE

STORE

NO. 1

Bargain Prices
LIQUOR - WINES

419 E. Third Phone1725

You'll save time, savesteps,savemoney... and

have a modern kitchen of streamlined beauty
with Kitchen-Kraf- t all-ste- el Cabinets.This

complete line of floor, wall, and sink cabinets
offers gleaming white refrigerator finish, finger-

tip control drawers, inlaid linoleum counter
tops, stainless steelor porcelain sink bowls. In
fact, Kitchen-Kraf- t Cabinetsprovide everything
you want and need,and they are easy to buy . . .
easy to install . , . delightful to use.

In Cool Mesh
by GrossSydney

W A
,..,....,

--. bS QJ " uaPPJ' uiKiiuiug ui unarm ana
- - cool comiort . . . soft tailored Kayon Mean

dressesby Gross-Sydne-y in one piece

styles . . . with plenty of the new pretty

feminine look . . . Navy, Copen, Grey,

Beige . . . threesmart tailored styles

. . . sizes 12 to 40 . . .

$24.95 and $29.95

"Big Spring's Favorite Department Store --
"

mSwk

E.122

vcttVJnvict

I.R R 0 R

GLASSES

As Pictured
In Life Magazine

DR. K. R. SWAIN
OPTOMETRIST

Third Phon 382

hlen&tffi&ijfi' STEEL KITCHENS
o.kHni"

Whether your kitcna Is old or mv, ktgt f
small, Kitchen-Kraf- t units can be to
give you ample work surfacesand storagesptee
. . . at a price well within your budget. Our
Kitchen-Kraf- t specialist will be glad to pka
your kitchen . . . and recommendthe KitibtH-Kra- ft

Cabinets that will assure outstanding
beauty, convenience,and economy. Why not
drop in tomorrow and let us help you male
your dream kitchencometrue the easy Kitchen-Kra- ft

way.

STANLEY HARDWARE
203 RUNNELS
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