
WDC Discusses Housing, 
Doctor And Business Firms

Jos BUI Pierce of Pierce, Pate 
and Associates, architects and 
planners of Midland, wss pres* 
entattlie monthly mnetlng for 
directors of tlie Wolverine De­
velopment Corporation Thurs­
day nl$it to discuss a govern­
ment housing project for 
Earth.

Pierce told the group how to 
go about getting tills low cost 
housing for Eartti and the re­
quirement for reutlngthe units. 
The WDC group will work In 
connection with the City 
Council on the project.

The announcement that Joe 
Salem had purchased Bryant's 
Department Store was made 
by Norlan Dudley.

While the meeting was In

b salon, Norlan Dudley, chief 
executive officer of tne C iti­
zens State Bank, called Dr. 
Hick nan In Bovina about his 
Intentions toward Earth, Dr. 
Hickman agreed to he In Earth 
one or two da\S each week 
He will have a receptionist at 
the office five days a week. 
The WDC will pay the rent 
and utilities for the first two 
months
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Directors present were Jimmy
-  ■ ~ -------n. W.

•oily Mi
ton, Dave Cavltt. Doug Par-

Ray Banks. Perry Martin.
B. Me Mi Han, Polly Middle-

Willis A. Hawkins, Jr. Named Chairman Of Local Bank
Ish ' and Bob Bclew. Others 
present Included attorney Andy 
Stroebel, Joe Bill Pierce, Nor­
lan Dudley, H. C. Martin and 
Larry Tunnell

S-E Enters Lamb Countg 
Junior Stock Show

WHUs A. Hawkins, Jr. of 
Hart announced Wednesday 
morning that lie had been 
named chairman of the board 
for Citizens State Bank In 
Earth. He will replace his

School Enrollment Down

Monday. January 11. was the 
deadline for entries In the 
Lamb County Annual Junior 
Livestock Show to be held at 
the County Show Barn In Lit­
tlefield January 14-16.

Several entries from Sprlng- 
lake-Earth School have been 
made Those entering In the 
4-H Club are Allen and Brent 
Been, calves and swine: Don­
ald Templeton. calf; Brad and 
Bruce BtI Iges, calves. Sheila 
and Petra Lewis, lambs; Kent 
Lewis swine.
Entering In FHA will be Wel­

ds Barton with two calves.
Entering In FFA will be Wcl- 

da Barton, 2 steers Hoyt 
Glasscock. 2 pigs-. Steve Ran­
dolph, 2 pigs: Barry Pittman,
pig: Don Templeton, pig: Le- 
land Dear, pig; Kent Lewis,

2 pigs-. Carl Sul^r. pig; Wel- 
don Eagle, pig; and Kevin An­
derson. pig.

Lamb judging starts at 5:30 
p. m. Friday, Joe Wise, Daw­
son County assistant agent, will 
do the judging.

Jim Allison, assistant agent 
forHowardCounty, will judge 
the harrows at 9 a .m . Satur­
day.

Floyd County Agent Doyle 
Warren will judge steers at 1
p. m

Immediately following the 
judging, presentation of plaq­
ues to tne winners of showman- 
shlpawards In the swine, ca t­
tle and lamb divisions will be 
made. This Is the first year 
that showmanship awards have 
been made. Checks will be 
distributed following the a- 
wards presentation.

Local Youths To 
Exhibit In Fort
Worth Stock Show

£ iium o-s.
on, 2 pigs; 
pig, Carl 
Slover, 2

Five local students will show 
entries In the 1971 Fat Stock 
Show to be held January 29 
through February 7 In Fort
Worth.

Students exhibiting from S-E 
will be Welda Barton, 2 
David Hinchllffe,
Sulser, pig: Greg 
pigs and Danny Bradley. 2 
pies.

■fiie Fort Worth F «  Stock 
Show Is recognized as one of 
the top five livestock shows 
In the country.
The first Stock Show was held 

In the spring of 1896 under the 
big shade trees along the Mar­
ine Creek on Fort Worth's north 
side. The Initial show was such 
a success that Its cattlemen- 
founders decided to build an 
annual event to provide a 
sliow window to the great 
Southwestern livestock Indus­
try. "

HIghllg its of the livestock 
show will Include selection of

the grand champion steer at 
'0 a .m . Wednesday, February 
3. and sale of champions at 
9 a .m . Friday, February 5.

A11 major breeds of beef ca t­
tle will he exhibited, Includ­
ing Angus, Brahma, Charolels, 
Hereford, Polled Hereford, Red 
Angus. Santa Gutrudls and 
Shorthorn. Also exhibited will 
be outstanding classes of sheep, 
swine, dairy cattle, poultry, 
rabbits and pigeons.

Tickets for the 1971 Stock 
Stow are available by mall 
fromtlie Southwestern Exposi­
tion and Fat Stock Show, P.O. 
Box 150, Fort Worth, Texas 
76 '01 .

Other events to be held at the 
Exposition and Fat Stock Show 
will be a children's barnyard, 
an educational exhihli snow­
ing mother and baby farm an­
imals In natural surroundings, 
a horse show, and a rodeo with 
guest star Judy Lynn and her 
seven-piece western band.

Mid-WinterC onference 
Held In Austin

epli
father, W A. Hawkins, St , 
In that position. Continuing 
his announcement, lie stated 
that Norlan Dudley, who lias 
beenactlve In banking opera­
tions here since tlie three men, 
W A. Hawkins. Sr , Dudta . 
and himself, purchased con­
trolling Interest In the local 
bank on September 3. 1968, 
would no longer be active In 
the local bank.

Bob Harriet, who has been 
named president of the local 
bank, will continue In that 
capacity. Hatbetlias been ac­
tive In tne local banking busi­
ness since his coming here In 
August of 1967 as vice presi­
dent.

Hawkins Indicated that a new 
vice president for tlie local 
bank would be secured In the 
very near future

Otner officers will remain 
the same. They include A. A. 
Parish as vice chairman Mrs. 
Ann Jones, cashier. Assistant 
cashiers are Mrs. Wayne Ruth­
erford, Mrs. Lynn Glasscock. 
Miss Helen Govet and Mis 
Leola Randolph Bookkeeper 
for the bank Is Mrs. Bill Free­
man and M i. James Self U 
secretary.

Directors for the local bank, 
which was founded 18 years 
agobyW R. Stockard, Sr. and 
his late son. W. R. Stockard.
Jr , are W.A. Hawkins. Jr , 
W. A. Hawkins, Sr. . Bob Har- 
ber, A. A. Parish. A E. Wheat- 
ley, Johnle Ha beret. Gene 
Brow.id, J A. Littleton, Jr. 
and E. C. Hudson.

Joe Salem
Bugs B rya n ts 

D ept. Store
Bill Bryant owner of Bryant's 

Department Store InEartn an­
nounced this week that lie had 
sold his store to Mr and Mis. 
Joe Salem of Sudan.

Salem, newownerof the store 
IS currently continuing the sale 
and closing out tlie merchand­
ise.

Salem has had tremendoua 
experience In management of 
depannnnt stores, having own­
ed and operated a store In Sudan 
for 23 years. Salem lias been 
retired for the past 15 years, 
giving of his time to civic and 
church project*.

Salem, in an interview. In­
dicated his plans were Indefi­
nite. He said he would continue 
here through the month of Jan­
uary, but was undecided as to 
what his plans would be be­
yond that date.

Mr and Mrs. Pete O'Hilr, 
Mr and Mrs Harold Fields 
and Mr. and Mis. Travis Jaq- 
uess attended a recognition 
dinner at the Fait Park Colis­
eum Saturday for Boy Scout 
Wo’k.

Tne S-E School Board met 
Mimday and dtsucssed several 
Itemsofbusliiess, among which 
WI- the enrollment. The en­
rollment this mixitli was as 
follows-Elementary 404, Junior 
High 12i High School 213. 
Special Education 30, making 
a total of 773 students

Tala Is a loss of 29 students 
from last months enrollment 
Tne enrollment loss Is enough 
to cause the loss of a teacher 
which l- .i serious matter.
The hiring of Mrs. Nancy 

Howard as Home Ec teacher

to replace Mrs Klin Murrell 
was approved

Mrs. Ralph Rudd was hired on 
a temporary basis to assess taxes 

Tne board a greed to deed pro­
perty back to O B Whltford 
that had been purchased because 
of delinquent taxes 

The budget progress was dis­
cussed and tne equalization 
board, which Is approved by the 
schooi hoard to equalize taxes, 
will have final authority on 
matters of equalizing values 
Two people met with tlie 

school board. W. O. Jones and

Aurelia Sanders
Miss Sanders pointed out that 

the town was In need of bus­
iness. and that the school, t ic  
largest potential buyer In the 
area was buying suppllo from 
other sources otTier than from 
businesses here who are bear­
ing the lax load of the school 
Her statements gave the board 
food for thought.
Those attending tlie meeting 

wore: Bill Minn, Norman 
Hinchllffe. Jerry Kelley, Ardls 
Barton, Jlm ny Craft, Gene 
Templeton, P, A Washington, 
and K. B. Parish.

A ll Region Band 
Try outsS To Be
Held Saturday

Ag Chemical Meet Set 
For February 10-11

LUBBOCK--The 18th annual 
Agricultural Chemicals Con­
ference to be held at KoKo 
Palace In Lubbock February 
10-11 Is designed especially 
for West Texas agriculture.

The lectures, papers and de­
monstrations will emphasize 
a theme of prudent and pro­
fitable use of agricultural 
chem icals."
Between 300 and 400 persons 

are expected to attend tlie 
conference sponsored by the 
West Texas Agrlcuitur.il 
Chemicals Institute In coop­
eration with Texas Tech Uni­
versity. Texes dntvsi-
V ii  V,.3?
the Texas Plant Food Institute

Three of the speakers who 
will highlight the February 11 
program ire Carl Tanner of
San Francisco, manager. Pro­
prietary Products. Ortho Di­
vision, Chevron Chemical 
Company James Conner of 
Washington, D C. . director

pany and president of tlie In­
stitute. will preside. One will 
go to a man In the chemicals 
Industry, the other In educa­
tion or research.

First day of the conference 
opens at 3 p. m February 10 
and Is devoted to meetings of 
the boards of directors of the 
Wen Texas Agricultural 
Chemicals Institute and the 
Texas Plant Food Institute, 
registration and a reception 
given by the agricultural 
chemicalsIndustry representa­
tives.

Additional Information about 
tlie coolaceuce iu*y be sib-

ment, Lubbock Chamber of 
Commerce, P O. Box 561, 
Lubbock, Texas 79400

of congressional affairs, Na­
tional Agriculture Chemicals 
Association; and Dt. John 
Shirley of Dallas, with the 
Communication Institute of 
America.

TannerwlUspeak on respon­
sibilities of the chemicals In­
dustry: Conner on legislation 
concerning agricult nra 1 chem­
icals, ana ” tries on profit­
ability In marketing.

Other speakers Include Dr. 
P L. Adklssou. head of the 
Department of Entomology. 
Texas A & M Unlverlsty Pr 
Jack Price, leader of agricul­
tural cliemlcals. Texas A&M 
Dr. B L. Allen, professor of 
tlie Texas Want Food Institute 

Research reports will he de­
livered by l>. Bob Mutter and 
D" Bob Berry of Texas A&M 
Dr. Alex Pope of Houston, 
chief agronomist, Occidental 
Chemical Company and Dr 
Charles Ward, professor of en­
tomology at Tech.

Two awards will be present­
ed at a luncheon at noon Feb­
ruary 11 at which H, S John­
son. of Lubbock, area manag­
er for StaufferChemlcalCom-

E a r th  Medical 

Center Open
Tlie Earth Medical Center 

opened this week for practice 
ot general medicine and sur­
ge™.

Dr. Hickman, of Bovina, will 
be at the center one day week­
ly, each Wednesday from 8 
a m  to 5 p. m

Mis David Hartman has been 
secured as receptionist for the 
Ms dlcal Center She will be 
on duty five days weekly from 
8 o'clock In tlie morning until 
5 o'clock In the afternoon to 
accept appsit it incuts.

Tlie McdlcalCenter is locat­
ed In the former Foust Clinic 
In Eartti.

Earth Lions 
To Sell 
SaletgFlares

Tlie Earth Lions Club met 
Tuesda y at their regular nxset- 
Ino and voted on a project of 
sellings* fety flares. The flares 
are on sale now and may be 
purchased from any Earth Lion. 

Safety flares, which are re­
commended by the National 
Safety Council and used by 
State Highway Patrols provide 
an emergency signaling sys­
tem that warns passing traffic 
of a dangerous situation

wiuai> i m  « • *  yw i U ap­
pears tint tite UnlteJ Stares
Department of Transportation, 
through xropoaed regulations 
governing Motor Vehicle Safe­
ty Standards. will require that 
all new automobiles be equip­
ped with safety flares--tills Is 
further proof of the necessity 
of having safety flares lu evert 
automobile.

Safety flare* Should alio be 
carried In every boat as sn e- 
mergenev warning and distreta 
signal t u t  can be reen for 
thousands of yards 

Money received from tlie sale 
of flares will go for the many 
projects of t l *  club.

All region band tryouts will 
be held Saturday, Jauurav 16, 
at Littlefield High School. 
This will he the Regional I ’ll, 
contest for Region 16. snail 
school division foi 2A, A and 
B classification schools

There will be an approximate 
42 achools participating. Of 
this group. 20 students are 
members of the High School 
Wolveri le Band. From rhe 20 
Wolverine High School Band 
members, only 5 are returning 
numbers from last year,

In tlie tryouts, students will 
be using music to be played 
by the All Region Band on Its 
final concert. Tills music will 
Include a modem classical, a 
rock and a co .temporary num- 
her, thus offering t e students

a variety of m iu a  : work. 
Those who make the ' l l  

Region Ba id will participate 
In rehearsab and a concert to 
he preaeuied at Monterey High 
School In Lubbock on Satur­
day. January 30, Tlie cotuert 
has been a aell-out In previous 
years. Tills is a joint concert 
featuring! iree bands--tl* jun­
ior high, small school and 
large School All Region Bands.

Director-cllnlclau for the All 
Region Band w'll be Gerald 
Hetnphelle, newly named ex­
ecutive secretary of tlie Great­
er Southwest M isle Festival 
beglnnlugthls year In Amarll 
lo. He Is a former director of 
tlie Phillips University Band in 
Enid. Oklahoma.

The organizational director 
Is John Stockdale Martin.

C of C Discusses Banquet
The Earth Chamber ofCom- 

mcrce met Friday for break­
fast at 7:00 a. m. at tlie Wol­
verine Drive In and discussed 
the annual Chamber of Com­
merce Banquet. A date for tlie 
banquet Is to be aelected co 
either a Thursday or Friday 
night In March and then sev­
eral different persons are to 
be contacted for a speaker af­
ter the date Is decided.

The correspondence was read. 
Among the letters was a letter 
from me Hereford Ch* miser of 
Commtrce concerning their

banquet for January 14 It Is 
hoped that at least four mem- 
hertof tie  Earth Chamber can 
be present for tie  Hereford 
banquet

Brochures on nov raising and 
t ie  number of nogs In'each 
county was furnished by South­
western Public Service Com ­
pany and they are on file in 
the Chamber office.

Tlie meeting was adjourned. 
Those stteuding were Perry 

Martin. Norlan Ehidles. Roger 
Haberer, Zou Wilson, M H 
Been, W B. McMillan, Leon 
Dent and Bill Scott.

Red Cross Discusses 
March Fund Campaign

M'. and Mrs, C L Douchin'! 
granddaughter and great- 
granddaughter, Mrs Forrest 
Covey and Donlta of Garland, 
arrived In their home Sunday. 
They will stay for an extended 
visit.

D P T  Clinic Held
Tne Second DPT clinic was 

held for the S-E area Wednes­
day at tlie Community Build­
ing. Attendance was less than 
at the first clinic.

A DPT clinic will he held tn 
Ottonat the Legion Hut across 
from Olton High School Mon­
day, January 18. It will open 
at | p m

It U necessary to receive i'oe 
second DPT sliot In order for 
t l*  first one to be effective. 
Tmse mining tlie clinic st 

BdV
Tlie migrant public health

Earth are urgedto go to Olton. 
it public

nurse, Myrtle Sutnrall, will 
administer Innoculatlous.

At a regular meeting of the 
Lamb County Chapter Ameri­
can Red Croat on Friday, Jan 
uary8, presided over by chair­
man, Mis D K. Lcoia d. M i 
Bonnie Haherei. fund cha Irman 
for March 1971 Fund Drive, 
asked that the board members 
have a report regarding tlie 
chairman for fund drive In their 
communities at tf e February 
5th regular meeting Tlie quo­
tas for each com nunlty will 
heannounced also at me Feb­
ruary meeting

Cards were read from service­
men In response to the ditty 
bags sent overseas at Christ - 
lias filled with coin'oft Items. 

A letter was read from Com­
manding Offlcet, Murine Air 
Group 16, stating, "O i behalf 
of the officers and men of 
Murine Air Group 16. may 1 
express our sincere thanks lor

A three-day mid-winter con­
ference for superintendents and 
board members began in Aus­
tin Wednesd.iv throng > Friday.

A variety of topics were dis­
cussed. Among those were 
some of the followlitg;

1 A new Health, Education 
and Welfare guideline relative 
to the free lunch program.

2. A new accounting system 
that schools will be going to 
wlthintbe next five years. T ie  
school Is now using a modified 
accrule system and will goto 
an accrule system

3. A new speclalstd program 
which Is s type of co-op pro­
gram Psychologists and speech 
therapists will be made avail­
able to schools

4. A new proposed method of 
determining state aid each 
district will receive T ie  mar­
ket value of land surrounding 
school districts will determine 
aid given to tlie school. T ils  
could cause lese state aid for 
the S-E school district

5. Textbookiand new chang­
es proposed

6. Accounting for federal 
funds. A local cltl/eni com­
mittee c s h i iposed of perents of 
thore special reading students 
will serve ss sn advisory com­
mittee ,

7. Hoese Bill 240 T ie  teach­

e r s  salary program 
Superintendent Bill Mann 

stated that the conference had 
a very Informative program 

Attending the conference 
wore BUI Mann, K. B Parish 
and P A. Washington.

Semester Tests 

Given This Week
Semester tests are being g|i 

en Thursday (today) and Ft 
day for the Sprlngleke-Ear 
High School

A student with a conflict In 
schedule Is to take the teat* 
at i;30  on Friday unless other 
arrangements can be mide with 
the teacher Involved to take 
them earlier

All students arc to remain In 
the test room the full test per­
iod

Jv - 
1- 

- Earth

Mr and Mi*. Wsyne Robbins 
of Here ford visited Sunday sf- 
ternoon In the home of hit 
jjerenta. Mr and k*s Jim
Robbins.

the Red Crosa 'ditty bags 
They wore distributed to our 
men on Saturday, 19 Decem­
ber 1970. Your thoughtfulness 
during tills holt Jay season has 
done much to ma kc our Christ - 
mas a little brighter. "
Those lu attendance were 

M's Doris Frey. Spade 'rs. 
Bonnie Haberer. Pleasant Val­
ley; M 'S. Lanore La Grange. 
Amherst Mr and M>s Roy 
S it wade J, P Arnold 
Sudan, lidon Franks Olton: 
Ruth Leonard. Hart Camp: 
and Roth Wade

Following is a copy of tlie 
letter received from Com­
manding Officer L C Street, 
111

Americai Red Cross
Bov 952
Little Field. Texas 79339 

Dear Friends;

O i hehalf of the officers and 
men of Marine Air Group-16, 
may 1 express our sincere 
thanks forthe Red Cross "IMtty 
Bags They were distributed 
to our men on Saturday, 
December 1970.

Your thi ughtfulrsew during 
tills Holiday Season has done 
note) to make our Christmas 
a little hrlglret,

O jt best to you In the new 
yaar

Sincerely,
L C street, ID 
Commanding Officer 
M- rlne Air Group-16

PUTUW WOLVtBETTES---The 1970-71 el 
rl£ht kneeling. Blanc* DtLaCerda Quency

ghtli grade basketball girls are left to and Tairl Smith. Standtng. Debbie Wilson, Kathleen Anderson Lisa Clayton, 
Lewis, Donna Denlel, Jennifer Tern- Vicki Watkins. Rosie Garcia, manager Sammy Johnston. coach; Peggy Gregory

on. Ginger Smith, McUaea Been, Ruth Street. Delores G arta. Agnes Palarto, Judy Heritage, Rose Mary Acevedo and Cindy UcAlpine.

Bookmobile To 

Be In  A r e a
T ie  High Plain* Book mobile 

will be In this area on t >e fol­
lowing dates
THURSDAY, JANUARY 25 
Amherst, 9 :1 5 - '0  '5  
Sprlnglste #1, l i ;0 0 - l l :4 6  
Spring la ke #2, 12:00 1 00 
Earth l;15 -3 ;45
FRIDAY, JANUARY 22 
Pleasant Valley, 10 00-11:00
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Eig h th  Graders Upset H a r t  Bog Scouts W ork On Badges
The Sprtnglake-Earth eighth 

grade boy* upaet Hart Monday 
night 33-84

Dickie Bradley led the scor­
ing with 12 polnti for high 
point man of the game 

Other junior Wolverine* mak­
ing the scoring were Lupe Flor­
es, 8; Dyke Gastou. 5 Edwin 
Fulfer, Terry Lively. Eric 
Freeman and Robert Garza, 
each scoring 2 points

8th G8A DE GIRLS 
Hirt eighth grade girls upset 

the Spring lake -Earth girls
25-12.

Scoring for the S-E team 
were Melissa Been, 8; Vicki 
Watkins. 2 Terri Smith, l. 
and A. Palaclo, 1.

7th GRA l£  GIRLS 
S-E seventh grade girls pass­

ed Hart with' a narrow lead 
21-19

The Boy Scouts6 ' 4 met Tuei- 
day night and worked on steps 
on merit badges Different 
badges studied were First Aid 
andRespect For The Fla 

Travis Jaquest and Jerry 
thorne attended 
little  field Monday

flaw-
ng In 
"The

Scoring for the local girls 
were Fonda Goodwin, 16; L'- 
Anna Sulser, 3; and Camille 
Hlnchllffe, 2.

C oW a

BIG JANUARY

CLEARANCE SALE
NOW

IN PROGRESS
SHOP and SAVE

B A R G A IN S  IN E V E R Y  D E P A R T M E N T

C o W a of Muleshoe

Beautification of America.
It was decided the boys will do 
a beautification program in 
Earth.

Twenty-two boys ware pres­
ent and Bill Morgan reported he 
felt an Interest In scouting has 
lncteased since the holidays. 

TravisJaquess has taken sev- 
era 1 boys on a work detail sev­
eral days ago to clean the 
Scout Den.
The counselors and scouts

wanted everyone to know they 
appreciated thoae who pur­
chased their candles and cards.

Goodw ill Centre 
N e ts S 5 11
The Goodwill Centre netted 

$5 10 In sales Saturday with 
requests given for small boys' 
shirts

Tire Centre will be open next 
Saturday In a new place. It 
will be moved to tne house 
west of the Wolverine Drive 
Inn.

Services Held 
For Father 01 
Local Man
Edgar Earnest Belew. 89 of 

Littlefield,' died Thursday In 
Medical Arts Hospital In Lit­
tlefield.

Services were held at 10 a. m. 
Saturday Inthe Hammons Fun­
eral Home Chapel with the tev. 
Johnnie Williams officiating. 
Burial was In Resthaven Cem ­
etery In Lubbock

Belew was born In Alabama. 
He was a retired farmer and a 
resident of Lamb County for 
8 years He was a member of 
the First Methodist Church In 
Cooper. He had been a resi­
dent the last three years in the 
H.wpltalltv House In Little­
field

Survivors are three daughters, 
Mrs D.E Apten of Weather- 
fotd, Mrs, H. V Morris of 
Delta. Coiorado and Mis. S 
I Beasen of Carlsbad. New 
Mexico; one son. R. H Belew 
of Earth; nine grandchildren. 
20 great-grandchildren and 
two great-great-grandchildren.

Services Held 
For K in  Of 
Area Residents
Funeral services for Mtl. 

John Garner, age 90, were 
Iteld In the Calvary Baptist 
Church ofGslnesvllle Tuesday, 
January 12. at 2 p m  with the 
pastor officiating

Burial was In tlie Gainesville 
Cemetery.

Mrs. Garner Is rise slater-la- 
law of Mrs. Alice Martin and 
the aunt of Mrs. R. S. Cole of 
Earth.

Mrs. Gamer and the late Mr. 
Garner were longtime residents 
of the Circle Back Community 
and were active In church and 
community affairs.

Survlvorsare two sons, Geor­
ge and Elmer of Gainesville; 
tnree sisters. Mrs. Ethel Lew- 
allynof Amarillo, Mrs. Mag­
gie Slunk* of Celeste and Mrs. 
Max Futloux of Greenville; 5

grandchildren, l step-grand- 
child, several gnat-grand­
children and 1 great-great- 
granddaughter.

Mr. and Mrs R. S. Cole and 
Mrs. Alice Martin attended 
the funeral services.

Frank Butter returned home 
Thursday from Central Plains 
GeneralHospItal In P'alnvlew.

M i. J. B. Thomas returned 
home Thursday front South 
Plains Hospital In Amherst af­
ter undergoing tests.

Our January

CLEARANCE SALE
Is Now

IN PROGRESS
SAVINGS O F  50% and M O R E

Tk& Ua/ukthk
Pla inview
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Published at Earth, Texas 79031 every Thursday except the 
first Thursday following Christmas.
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SUBSCRIPTION RATE

Earth and Trade Territory, per year.........................................$3. 50
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Thank You
FR IEN D S  and NEIGHBORS

F O R  YOUR C O N T R I B U T I O N S  T O W A RD  PURCHASING

THE NEW CHRISTMAS LIGHTS
City of Earth 
Citizens State Bank 
Dudley Insurance Agency 
Wolverine Drive Inn 
Eirth News-Sun 
Modern Hair Design 
Earth Insurance 
Howell s 216 Floral 
U ilque Fashions 
Sawyer Fertilizer 
Rutherford 66 Station

Qulcksa 11-Pryor 
W. C. Maxcey 
Taylor Market Basket 
Harold Britton 66 Station 
Earth OB & Gas
Southwestern Public Service Co. 
Bill Freeman 
Rcdl-Fuel Inc.
Earth Ag Supply 
Sawyer Fertilizer 
Barton Bros Gin

E. C. Hudson
Earth Pump St Machine
Co-op Gins
Donald Runyon
L. K. Anderson
Arnold Shelby
Dent Farm Supply
K. M. P, Lake Pump Co
Farm Chemical Co. of Earth
Pioneer Natural Gat
M E. Phillips

EARTH CHAMBER of COMMERCE 
and AGRICULTURE

Austin. Texas, has more 
swimming pools than any com­
munity In the nation In the 
same population range.

Austin. Texas. Is the home 
of the Lone Star State's only 
ttemwheeler. The Rlverboat 
Commodore, which catrlei 
excurs onlstsupanddown Lake 
Austin s waters.

P U B L I S H E R ’ S C O P Y

(zmsulidstrd Report of  Condition of “ 
of EARTH in the S|a|e of Texee

businrss on December 31 , 19 70 .

Citizens State Bank ”

and IkmiMlir Subnidiarien at the close of
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S A V E R S  W A N T E D  - Now paying  
the m a x i m u m  a l l o w a b l e  bank i n ­
t e r e s t  r a t e  to s a v i n g s  a c c o u n t  d e ­
p o s i t o r s  wil l ing  to m a k e  s a f e ,  
s e c u r e  i n v e s t m e n t s  in f in a n c i a l  
f u tu r e  of this  c o m m u n i t y .  Get  
c u r r e n t  top r a t e  of 4 L/2% on 
p a s s b o o k  s a v i n g s  a c c o u n t s  a t  
C it iz e n  Sta te  B ank.

T h e r e ' s  a n o t h e r  r e a s o n  to s a v e  
with u s .  Money on d e p o s i t  in a 
c o m m u n i t y  is  put to w o rk  h e r e ,  
m a k in g  b u s i n e s s  and a g r i u c l t u r e  
e x p a n s i o n  p o s s i b l e ,  a s s u r i n g  a 
s o u n d e r  f i n a n c i a l  future  f o r  a l l  
in the c o m m u n i t y .

You c a n  a l s o  put y o u r  m o n e y  to 
w o rk  a t  5 1 /2%  on o n e - y e a r  c e r t i f i ­
c a t e s  of d e p o s i t  (m in im u m  $ 1 , 0 0 0 )  
and 5 3 / 4 % o n  t w o - y e a r  c e r t i f i c a t e s  
of d e p o s i t  ( m i n i m u m  $ 1 , 0 0 0 ) ,
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A S S E T S

1 Cash and due from b an k, (tndudlnx * ---- L .  7 4 t .  1 4  uni
«. u a  rr,i« i„
S. Securities of other U.S. Government agencies and corporation*
4 Obligation* of Stataa and political tubdivision*
5. Other eecuritiaa {including $__________________________corporate etockai
6 Trading account aacuritiea
7. Federal fundi aold and eecuritiea purchased under agreement! to resell
8. Other loan*
9. Rank premiaea. furniture and (Uturea, and other anaeu representing bank pietntse

10. Real estate owned other than bank premiaas
11. Investment* in subsidiaries not consolidated
12. Customer's liability to this bank on acceptance* outstanding
13. Other asset*
14 TOTAL ASSETS

L I A B I L I T I E S
IS. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 
16 Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations
17. Deposits of United States Government
18. Deposits of States and political subdivisions
19. Deposits of foreign governments and official institutions 
20 Deposits of commercial banks
21. Certified and officer*' check*, etc.
22. TOTAL DEPOSITS »

(• i Total demand deposits t
(b) Total time and savings deposits I

23. Fedsral funds purchased and securitise sold under agreement* to repurchase
24. Other liabilities lor borrowed money
25. Mortgage indebtedness
26 Acceptances executed by or for account of this hank and outstanding 
27. Other liabilities
28 TOTAL LIA BILITIES
29 MINORITY IN TEREST IN CONSOLIDATED SU BSID IA RIES

R E S E R V E S  ON L O A N S  A N D  S E C U R I T I E S
30 Raaervr for bad debt losses on loans set up pursuant to Internal Revenue Service ruling*
31. Other reserve* on loans
32. Reserves on securities
S3 TOTAL RESERV ES ON LOANS AND SECU RITIES

Doi.uuts Ct*

TĤ ooT'IT1
19

N
918 22

N
N
N

662 861 26u in n
H

J . J 1 2 . 2 1
2 6 2; 3fl4

541

°28
363

L  139,230 .  14

.i
m  xxx
xxx xxx
xxx xxx

473

m
465

N
606
066
xxx
xxx
xxx
N
N
N
N

2
3
4
5 
«
7
8 
9

10
11
12 
13

_ L 2  14

7 3 ^  «

~ r - & n r

32 isii 16
? 7  17

i 1908 20
62 21
xx I 22 
X X  ■ (a)
xx (b)

23
24

I 25 
28
27
28 
29

30
31
32
33

34

38.
38

17.

18.
39
40
<1
42.

C A P I T A L  A C C O U N T S
Capital notas and debentures

specify interest rate and maturity of each issue outstanding)
Equity capital, total

Preferred stock-total par value 
{No shares outstanding 

Common stock-total par value 
(No. shares authorised 7 ,  5 0 0  N ,

Surplus
Undivided profits
Reserve for contingencies and other capital reserve*

TOTAL CAPITAL ACCOUNTS
TOTAL LIABILITIES. RESERVES. AND CAPITAL ACCOUNTS

N 34

tharee outstanding 7 , 5 0 0 -------)

M E M O R A N D A
1. Average of total deposits for the 15 calendar days ending with call date
2. Average of total loans for the 15 calendar days ending with rail date
I. Unearned discount on instalment loans included in total capital account.

N 38

7 5  0 0 0 0 0 37

1 2 5  0 0 0 0 0 38
1 2 f  9 7 2 7 7 39

40$ir

+ 4 41
42? w mw 1

2
N 3
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Area ScoutAssociationSet 
Thursday, January 21

Girl Scout Area Association 
MeetingII will he held Thurs­
day at 9 30 to 2:30 in Jan­
uary 2i in tlie First Baptist 
Church at Sprlnglake.

A Continental Breakfast will 
be Served prior to the meeting 
for those attending Each one 
should brings covered dish for 
the luncheon,

A discussion of general ad­
ministration and council ser­

vices will be held In a buzz 
session. Those attending are 
asked to have suggestions for 
programs ramping, training 
and troop organization. "Re­
member, girl scouting Is girl 
buslness-the development of 
a happy. resourireful citizen 
at today and tomortow ' 

From l0:30a.m  to 2  30p in., 
Mrs. Joe M King of Plain- 
view. will present caravan

training In paper machette. 
All leaders, co-leaders and 

workers In scoutsare urged to 
attend.

Towns attending the meeting 
will be 'x v e lU n j Littlefield.
Olton, Sudan. Anton and 
Sprlnglake-Earth.

f t + t i cj

JO u r _
?ln Service
c T L  — — ' — — -»«-

USS ALBANY— Navy Petty 
Officer Third Class Jose L

JANUARY

IS NOW IN PROGRESS
Many-Many Savings On Men’s Clothing Items

Ellezrraraz. son of Mi and 
Mrs. Jose L Ellezrraraz of 
Miiledioe, Is serving aboard 
rise guided missile cruiser USS 
Albany at Mayport, Florida

SAN BERN A RDINO, C A U F .~  
Staff Sergeant DavidE. Wllle- 
brand, son of Mrs. Irene G. 
WUlebrand, 942 Second St. , 
Clatkston, Washington, Is a 
member of the 1365th Photo- 
graphlc Squadron tliat hat re­
ceived the U, S. Air Force 
Outstanding Unit Award 

Sergeant WUlebrand Is an 
administrative specialist at 
lieadquarters, Norton AFB. 
California.

The 1365th, with widely- 
scattered units, provides doc­
umentary photography for the 
AlrFotce worldwide--exclud­
ing Southeast Asia and It a 
component of tlie Aerospace 
Audio-Visual Servioe.

Squadron achievements dur­
ing tlie past year Included re­
locating hea dquaiters from O - 
Undo, Florida, to Norton, 
Implementing television as a 
documentary tool and cover­
age of operations that ranged 
from NATO '.raining exerciaes 
to relief airlift for Peruvian 
flood victims and the recovery 
ofthethreeastronautsafter the 
near disastrous Apollo 13 mis­
sion.
Sergeant WUlebrand will 

waara distinctive service rib­
bon to mark his affiliation with 
the unit.

The sergeant Is a 1960 g'ad- 
uate of clarkston Senior High 
School. His wife, Melynda, Is 
the daughter of Mr. and M-s. 
Roy L Ritchie. J t . . Rt. 2. 
M’. leshoe.

HAMPTON, V A .--U .S  Air 
Force Technical Sergeant R. L 
Gabbert. son of Mrs W C 
McMahan, Mule shoe, has ar­
rived for duty at Langley AFB, 
VtrglnU.

Sergeant Gabbert, an e le c­
tronics equipment repair tech­
nician, Is asslgnedto a unit of 
the Tactical Air Command. 
Ho has served 12 months In 
Vietnam and before arriving 
at Langley, was assigned to an 
Air Force support unit on Guam. 
The sergeant Is a 1955 grad­

uate of Muleshoe High School. 
Ills wife. Yvonne, Is tlie 
daughter of Mrs. E.E, McQulg- 
gan of Fort Lauderdale, Fla.

Y F  To M eet

Washington ASCS Oiiicials Study 
Requirements For Set-Aside Acres ]

Tlie offlcla I residence for tlie 
Governor of Texas In Austin 
-vasbulltln 1865 slid still ser­
ve: as tlie mansion for tlie first 
lamlly of the Lone Star State.

FIELDS
CLEANERS MEN'S W EAR

512 Phelps Ave .  .  L i t t l e f ie ld  -  P h :  3 8 5 - 3 2 3 3

Tuesday
Tlie Sprlnglake-Earth Young 

Farmers will schedule a meet­
ing Tuesday. January 19. at 
7:00 p m In the Vocational

Speaker for the evening will 
he Elmer Hudspeth from tlie 
LubbockExpetlioe italStation.

Plains Cotton Growers, Inc. , 
among others, has registered 
strong opposition to a ruling 
which would require that set- 
asldeacreaunderthe 197' cot­
ton program lie cropland that 
has produced a crop for har­
vest within the three preced­
ing years. And ASCS offlcla Is 
111 Washington are known to be 

taking a second look' at the 
regulation.

In a letter to Kenneth Prick, 
ASCS Administrator, PCG Ex­
ecutive Vice President Donald 
Johnson pointed out that the 
requirement could not be ad­
ministered to all farmers a- 
like would Increase produc­
tion costs on many farm! with­

out greatly affecting volume 
of production; would result In 
a waste of Irrigation water 
which desperately needs con­
serving. and would void some 
of the benefits expected from 
government expenditures un­
der conservation program: 

According to Johnson tlie reg­
ulation cannot be equitably 
administered because county 
ASCS offices do not have a 
record of crop acreage location 
on ail farms for the oast three 
years. They have tliese rec­
ords only on farms where ASCS 
personnel were employed by 
the farmerto measure crops lu 

of the three yea™, sod 
on farms wliere ASCS "spot 
ctiecked" farmer measure­
ments Also, there are farri­
ers who have bought or leased 
new acreage for 197] and 
these have no way of knowing 
which part oftlie liew farm hat 
produced a cron for harvest In 
1968. 1969 and '970 
Tlie objective of the regula­

tion, of course, is to make 
sure that set-aside acreage Is 
normally productive land. 
While voicing no objection to 
this purpose, PCG Is taking the 
position tliat the objective can 
oe reached by other meant 
which will not cause unneces­
sary hardship and expense on 
the fsrurer

Production cost Increases, ac­
cording to the PCG letter, will 
come aboui In more than one 
way. Farmers In some cates 
will be forced to dig new Irri­
gation ditches or buy new Irri­
gation pipe to get water to 
farm sections tint lie farther
Tlie title 
"Broadcast

ol tlie program Is 
and Narrow

< o t i c  ! ‘r e d u c t io n  
Anyone Who wmild he Inter­

ested In attending will be wel­
come Refreshments will be 
served.

i

5 ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Y E A R S
★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

\ S 2\ - \ S T \
■  They say that the first 50  years  a re  the hardest

but for us the n ext 50 will be even h ard er —  it’s our intention to  

m ake it so. I t’s our intention to work even hard er than ever 

to continue bringing to you the finest electric service  

a t the lowest possible cost 

(md in a socially responsible manner.

■  So long as we do th a t you’ll continue to be a valued 

and satisfied custom er.

i

1 930 5

I 1

from existing Irrigation wells. 
Tlie letter states that "Irrigat­
ed acreage will not be reduc­
ed, but (he farmer's ex (reuse 
will be materially Increased 
and the loss of water associat­
ed with moving It extra dis­
tances will he substantial. " 

There are Instances in which 
a farmer will have to plow up 
rye or some ot'ier soli conserv­
ing crop which government 
money helped to establish un­
der tlie Agricultural Conserva­
tion Program Then the farm­
er would be out additional 
money putting another part of 
his laud la a soil-conserving 
crop

Also, some producers have 
already applied fertilizers and 
herbicides to the land tliey 
expected to use for crop pro­
duction In 1971. And some If 
not all of this expense will 
have been wasted Ifat this late 
date they are required to 
change plans

When tliese points were ex- 
lalned to one USDA official 

reportedly admitted that 
"this sounds like a bad regula-

A chain of seven man-made 
lakes on the Colorado River 
begin a 150-m lle water play­
ground In t!«  city limits of 
Austin, Texas.

Famous author O Henry be­
gan writing short stories as a 
sideline while working In Aus­
tin, Texas, as a bank clerk. 
His one-time Austin home 1$ 
now a museum reaturlng many 
of hit personal effects.________

A series of seven dams on the 
ColoradoRlverat Austin, T ex ­
as, store over one trillion gal­
lons of water, and supply e - 
nough power fora city of more 
than one million people

tlon. " But li remains tone seen 
wnat language. If any. UbUA 
candevlae which will accom­
plish program objectives with­
out causing undue hardship on 
producers

Tlie State Capitol at Austin, 
Texas. Is built of pink granite 

nd ranks second In size only 
to the National Capitol In
Washington.

Tlie average year-round tem­
perature In Austin. Texas, Is 
C8. 3 degrees

PUlie

FARMERS SUPPLY CO.
M & M Power Units & Equipment 

Miller Offset Discs 
LiHiston Cultivators & Equipment 

Tye DriMs & Planters 
S & 5 V Chisel Plows 

Bush Hoq Cutters 
Dempster Plonters 

Cooper Tires & Service 
American Bosch Magnetos

AM Makes Used Equipment

If W e Don't Have, We d G et It

Come In And Give Us A Try 
W e Service What W e Sell

Phone 647-3350 - Dlmmllt

wonderful bugs iu

januarg clearance
sportswear

* 100 im ported wool pant suits
three-piece fully-fathtoned Imported wool

r 'n *“ tts ln.great new brlghr colors tizei 
thru 16 In four unusual new styles. 49 90

’ 110 imported wool pant suits
very fine t iree- and four-piece pant suits-- 
•oinc with skirts to match—iri the world's 
finest make, most beautifully done, from 
sizes 8 thru 18. 6990

*G5washable polyester pant suits
stunning two-piece, machine washable poly­
ester pantsuits In gorgeous colors and many 
new wearable style: all year-round t\per 
from 8 thru 18. 4490

new fa l l dresses
about two hundred missy and junior dretres 
In polyester, wool, dacron /wool blends, 
crepes, silks a host of lovclv things at a 
great price.

30 - 50%  
13!S ■ 39

off

90

winter cold weather coats
c a r  c o a t s  wet  looks wool co ats  

a l l - p u r p o s e  c o a t s  m axi  co ats

25 - 50% off

s w e a t e r s  s k i r t s  b lo u ses  pants

2 0 t o 4 0 % off

’ 25 wool ponchos
multl-colurful wool knit 
nuhbytypc* handsome styles

10"
*14 wale corduroy 

skirts
cute new skirts In blue, brown, 
pecan and m ulti-colon jun- 

........

‘ 30 leather
fringed vests

jenulne leather short and 
Tong fringe vests In several 

! o*i i n q q10
*8 long sleeve shirts
famous brand no-iron com ­
pletely washable shirts In 
white and colors 30 to 36.

5"
16 pant top blouses
multi-color pantops In long 
sleeves from <0 thru .38. 
many, many styles. ^

lingerie
*25 negligee sets

Shadowllne and miss elalne 
lovely robe 'gown nylon sets 
In feminine colors.

14 " I
*18 long fleece robes

completely washable flue 
tailored stylet, all sizes, 
beautiful soft colors. 10"

Itte M a s s e y -F e r g u s o n

TRACTOR TRADING
Now's the time to fake your time to work out a 
BETTER DEAL on the tractor you went with the 
equipment you want Oat a BETTER TRADE IN 
becauee we went your old tractor in our shop now 
NO FINANCE CHARGES TH. NEXT MARCH 1st

Fry 4  Cox, Inc. 401 S. First 
M t U t h t *

ie s s e e e e s a * a « A R 4 .
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The
met

Senior Citizen* group 
on Wednesday for their 

monthly covered dish lunch* 
eon at one o'clock.

Rev Glen Smith of Spring- 
lake Baptist Church gave 
thanks for the meal and when 
the meal wat over, gave a 
short devotional.

The Earth Baptist ladles had 
charge of the program that fol­
lowed First a sing-song of old 
fa miliar hymns were led by A1 
Sanders with Zou Wilson at tlie 
piano. Zou also favored the 
group with a number ot piano 
selections. The humorous 
readings given by Mrs David

Hartm3n was much enjoyed by 
everyone present.

At the conclusion of the pro-

frarn quite a number played 
2 and 84 for quite some time 
Those having birthdays In 

January were H S Hickman. 
Zou Wilson, Ida Allen, and 
Lottie Orteg and were seated 
at the head table The birth­
day long was sung for them. 

Of course, the whole event 
was Interspersed with visiting 
and fellowship, w ilch makes 
the monthly event so enjoy­
able. The next meeting will 
be on February 3. Those at­
tending this time In spite ot

very cold weather were Bon­
nie Haberer, Beula Coker, Zou 
Wilson, Ola Fanning. R W. 
Fanning Leonard Green, 
Gladys Goodwin. Ida Allen, 
Rubs' Jones. Aimer Barton, 
Edith Brockette, Bessie Gear- 
ley. Marie Ross, H S. Hick­
man. Annie Runyon. Minnie 
Pate. Jessie Sanders, Homer 
Sanders, Jack Hinson. Bea 
Hinson, Ai Sanders Mae Ham­
ilton. Lottie Orteg. Kathleen 
Cole. Frankie Hartman. Matt 
Patterson. Rev. Glen Smith, 
Dean Jones, Judith Jones and 
Blanche Hudson.

T/i/xyp IOI R/te/ Safety
Earth Brownie Troop 101 dis­

cussed Fire Safety at their 
meeting Tuesday. The girls 
were shown what to do In caao 
they are by themselves, a fire 
occurs In their home and their 
clothes catch on fire They 
were taug t how to roll up In 
a rug. Fonda Goodwin taught 
them the "BugIn A Rug” game 
Illustrating safety.

The girls decided as a service 
project to wrap coffee cans 
with a red fire label and dis­
tribute the cans to homes so 
people may put baking; soda In 
t em to extinguish fires on 
stoves The cans were given 
by the fire department 

Refreshments of cookies and 
Kool-Ald were brought by 
Sheila Jordan and served to 
Kim Locke, Jodie Daniel,

Debra Houston, Stiaron Jack- 
son, Lisa Taylor. Rhonda Wea­
ver, Delma Gonzalez, Diana 
Hoskins, Stephanie Parish. 
Danlella Bltone. Carrie Been, 
Jackie Hood. Beverly Hood 
and Gloria Ptice.

UMl| S/t. -WiTjk

Mfipx*
T ie  UMY Settlor High of the 

Earth United Methodist Church 
met Sunday afternoon with 
fifteen present.
The group had a program on 
Success. The program 

brought out opinions on wheth­
er success Is good or had and 
how to cope with success

We wish to express our thanks 
for the kindness shown us dur­
ing the passing of our loved 
one. The gifts of food, visits, 
prayers and floral offerings 
were all a comfort during our 
hour of need

Friends are one of life ’s 
greatest treasure and we have 
been blesseJ by your friend- 
shop shown to us during this 
time. May God bless and'keep 
each of you.

TcWivt/i Daniel, 5/t. flotmext FIqa
On

, 'PpMonnl

Members of tlie Olton State 
Bank honored Kaiford Daniel. 
Sr In tlie coffee room o ' the 
bank December 31. Daniel 
retired January 4 after having 
heen employed as teller st tlie 
bank for 15 years.

Earl Sprulell, president of 
the bank, In behalf of all em ­
ployees, presented Daniel with 
a gift.

Daniel, being the first em ­
ployee to retire from Olton 
State Bank, wilt continue to 
work at the hank pan time.

Daniel has three children, Mu. 
Richard Snell ofCIovU. New 
Mexico Mrs Ronald Curtis of 
Tucson. Arizona, and Halford 
Daniel, Jr of Earth.
A special Invited guest was 

Mrs. Ralford Daniel, Sr

'VnidinpMurkh TCTP>2 Qtte-eit
The regular meeting of the 

TOPS Happy Losers met Thurs­
day with Mis. Fred Clayton 
presiding In a new meeting 
place. Fifteen members were 
present In the reception room 
of the local dentist’s office. 
Weight recorder. Mrs. Allen 
Gover, recorded a loss of 1} 
pounds and a gain of 39 pounds.

Mrs Pauline Mucks was nam­
ed Queen of tlie Week with a

loss of 1J pounds.
Mrs. Fred Clayton's name 

was drawn from the capsule 
for the dollar prize.

Several past members were 
reinstated.

A gripe session was held to 
register complaints about club
meetings.

Mts. Babe Prather remains In 
Deaf Smith County Hospital 
111 Hereford.

The Wesleyan Service Guild 
of tlie United Methodist Church 
met Monday evening and dis­
cussed risk 111 relationship In 
the local church. Tlie program 
wasglvenby Mis Beulah New­
ton snd Mrs Burl Hamilton snd 
concerned personal risk In con­
fessing one s faults and fail­
ures to another and how do we 
com nunlcate with each otlier.

Ruby Jonei served cake and 
coffee to Mrs John Welch. 
Mrs. Johnnie Williams, Mis. 
Hershel Belew. Mis. Burl 
Hamilton and Mis Beulah 
Newton.

Mr and Mrs. Carol Cole and 
son, Kenny, of Lubbock visit­
ed with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. R. S. Cole, Sunday af­
ternoon

(ML

Mi
Mi
Mr.
Mi

and Mis. 
and Mrs 
and Mrs. 
and Mis.

D.E. 
S I 
H V 
R. H

Upten 
Bea son 
Morris 
Be lew

MRS. CAROL COLE 
(nee Linda Preston)

JANUARY EXPANSION SALE
*>ne Table Of Virgin Wool

NORDIA
(blend of wool A rayon) 

Made In Belgium .leg. $1. 29

per Skein

and Alfgan

Kirs

Off

Next D>or To Dcx's Shop - Mnleshoe

Tbt| am

'Pm tm  - Co
Arwwced

Mi and Mrs. S E Harrison 
of Lubbock announce the re­
cent wedding of their daughter, 
Mrs Linda Gail Preston. Lub­
bock, to Carol R. Cole also 
of Lubbock.

Tlie couple were married at

EoAlkfi/1, - S 5

Clm Meet
Tlie Easther Sunday School 

class met at Mrs. Rex d a y -  
ton's home Tuesday at 7:00 
p. m. for a salad supper.

A m on  butiiMU m eeting was
Im U will. M  i  m u  a .w
presiding A .isltatlon program 
was presented.

Mrs Marvin Sanders gave 
the devotional

Those attending were Mrs. 
BUI Anderson. Mis. Ted Ha­
berer. Mis Guy F Kelley, 
Mis Jay Winders. Mis Edwin 
O'Hair, Mis. Pete O'Hair. Mrs 
Jlmm/Craft, MissSlmako Su- 
kato. ’ Mrs Gerald Inglls and 
Mrs. Rex Clayton,

10-30 a. m. January 4 in a 
civil ceremony at tlie Lubbock 
Courthouae, performed by 
Justice of the Peace, Wayne 
Le Croy.
Cole Is the son of Mr and 

Mrs R. S Cole of Earth and 
a graduate of Sptlnglake-Earth 
High School He served with 
the Armed Forces from Octo­
ber 1966 to September 1968, 
Including one year in Ger­
many.
Cole Is a sheet rock contrac­

tor In Lubbock. Nfrs. Cole at­
tended beauty school In Lub­
bock prior to ner employment 
at tlie Cattlemen's Cafe 

The couple ire now at home 
at 2102 -  33rd Street in Lub- 
bork.

Folks

And

We Have Sold Our Store To Mr. A Mrs. Joe 
Salem. Who Are No Newcomers To The Cloth- 
lngBuriness Tney Will Very Ably Serve Your 
Needs And Will Contribute Greatly T.o This 
Area, Both ftom A Business Standpoint And 
PersonalEndeavors. Earth Is Fortunate ToHave 
These Fine Folks In It's Midst.

F m  y i m P o i / U H i a q p y

Fdend\kip Ow/tTBie/ IJeAM!

I t  U qa B ppji O uA.'PlpM um  

And Good Fodun&To 
Lbypj InJ^hAhP/h 

and ^ pam

M̂>. (§■ M

'B / U ja n t i  DEPARTMENT STORE
E a r t h

CLOSE-OUT
SALE

CONTINUES

E N T I R E  S T O C K  O F  Q U A L I T Y  C L O T H IN G S ,  
R E A D Y - T O - W E A R ,  S H O E S ,  AND F U R N I S H ­
INGS F O R  TH E WHOLE F A M I L Y  TO B E  
C L O S E D  O U T A T . . .

HALF PRICE
OR

LESS

It Will  Pay P e o p le  F o r  M i le s  Around To Com e In And Shop.  
While S om e I te m s  Are Running Low, T h e r e  Is S t i l l  Much To 
Be Found In All D e p a r tm e n ts  At G r e a t  S a v in g s .

WE I-COM E TO C O M E  IN AND LOOK AROUND

F o r m e r ly

V

Bryanft Dept. Store
E A R T H ,  T E X A S  

P u r c h a s e d  By Jot Saltm

* i



Fom ueJtl Parity C cuhUa EoAtjpm Sto/ty -Ha& Effictimi

Of OfficeChurch of Chrlit friends gave 
the Dave Cavltt family a Fare­
well Party Sunday evening In 
the E a rt h C oin i n un It y Build In g. 
Approximately 85 people at­
tended a covered dish supper 
to wish the Cavhts the best of 
luck In their new home,

BUI Mann made a presenta­
tion speech and told how much 
the community respected the 
Cavltts for all they had con­
tributed.

The table decorations were 
high wire Insulators holding 
candles. The head table had 
high wire Insulators with mon- 
envelopes hanging from the 
wires. Also a money basket 
was placed on the table.
Cavltt has been very active 

In his community and has 
lielped wherever he was need­
ed. lie was treasurer for the

Chamber of Commerce, Di­
rector of WDC. Tail Twister 
In the Earth Lions, member 
of the fire departrncnt, Boy 
Scout Neighborhood Chairman 
and Director of the OP1,

UM(>] J/t. -Hiqk
MftfctA

The UMK Junlot High of the 
United Methodist Church met 
Sunday and discussed accept­
ing persons who are different. 
L'Anna Sulser presented the 
program on people having 
preiudlcesandacted out a skit 
entitled "How To Hurt A Guy 

Refreshments of punch and 
cookies were served to L'Anna 
Sulser, Gena Wlslan, Dyke 
Gaston. Fonda Goodwin and 
leader. Mrs. C .C  Goodwin.

The Eastern Stars met In a 
regular meeting Monday with 
Mri. Forrest Simmons. Worthy 
Matron, presiding In an e lec­
tion of officers.

A Mother Advisor was e le c t­
ed with an advisory board for 
Rainbow Girls. Mottier Advis­
or Is Mrs Jimmy Shlrey. Her 
advisory board Is Mrs Doug 
Lewis. Mrs, C. C. Goodwin, 
Mrs. Johnny Murrell Johnny 
Murrell. Leonard Green. Mrs. 
Forrest Simmons, Mrs. Jimmy 
Craft, Mis. Marcus Messer, 
Mrs Norlan Dudley. Mis. 
Norman Hlnchllffe, Mrs M H 
Been. Mrs. Melvin Bock and 
Mrs J. A Littleton. Jr

Tire officers - i l l  be Installed

January 30 with the new of­
ficers of Rainbow Girls.

Refreshments of cake, coffee 
and hot tea were served by 
Mrs. John Laing. Sr. and Mrs, 
L K. Anderson,

IrutiM e, Mftur

Lotlq&
The Rehekahs Instituted the 

Sunset Rebekah Lodge 333 In 
Littlefield Saturday. Helping 
In the ceremony were Henri­
etta Armstrong District Dep­
uty 8 of Earth Rebekah Lodge 
and President of tire Rebekah 
Assembly of Texas, Mirqurlte 
Ayers ol Levelland 5. assisted 
byOna Berry, Assembly Inside 
Guardian. Cora Mae Shirley. 
Assembly Chaplain; Beatrice 
Cox, District Deputy President 
of Levelland Elrna Scarbrough, 
Lodge Deputy; Mildred Ken­
dricks left Support, and Lu­
cille  Henderson. Right Support 
of Earth,

Six members were brought In 
by card and Initiation was held 
by the Levelland Rebekah Lod­
ge 5 for eight candidates.

A delicious supper of turkey 
and trimmings was served 

Two past presidents were 
present, Sisters President Geot- 
dla Ford Amarillo 222 and Lil­
lie Alexander Auld Lubbock 
321.

Notice
There will be a pre-nuptial 

shower for Donna Benke, bride- 
elect of Leslie Blrkenfleld, 
Tuesday. January 19, from 4-
5:30 p. m In the S-E H' me 
Ec Cottage.

Selections are at Sanders 
Lumber In Earth and Higgin­
botham Lumber at Mulesnoe

The N. Ray Kelley's and tfie 
J A. Littleton. Sr '8 returned 
from a 10-day fishing trip at 
Falcon Tlie trip was delight­
ful quoted Mrs Littleton. She 
stated the fishing was excel­
lent.

WHITESALE
Ultra Quality 

Sheets and Towels 
by Wamsutta

Storewide 
Reductions on 

All Linen Prices

SHEETS TOW ELS BLANKETS PILLOW S
Beautiful, C o lo r­

ful, Luxurious, 
No-Iron Sheets 
by W am sutta

in a W ide 
A rray  of Colors 

. . . Solids and 
Patterns

A ll Beautiful 
and Warm 

A ll Sizes . . .

Dacron or 
Imported 

Down.
Standard or King

ALL ALL ALL ALL
REDUCED REDUCED REDUCED REDUCED

(J3ecl &  (f3ath l^ashion S k
3033 34th L u b b o c k  712-0363

Open 10 A.M. - 4 P.M___ till t  P.M. Thun.

op

Gt-A a TAouf Stmq PirfuAAS
The Springlake GA’s drew 

story plct ires Wednesday. Jan­
uary 6. The girls divided Into 
three group* and read from 
Discovery Magazine. Each 
group read three stories In 
which they I lad to draw pic­
tures to finish the ending of 
the stories. The stories were 
entitled "Kathy Sees Some­
one Who Needs Help". "Kathy 
Thinks How Others Feel" and 
"Kathy Gets An Idea.
The unit title for this month

is "Who Needs Me "
Mrs. Delvln Walden, leader, 

read a story, "Being Friends 
With a Handicapped Person 

A prayer calendar was given 
for Islaii Valdivia, a mission­
ary In Texas
Refreshments of brownies were 

served by Mrs. Wayne Davis 
toRauae Winder, Tammy Da­
vis, Bobbie M nely. Jaton 
Schellar. Gall Miller. Teresa 
Lunsford. Sheryl Clayton and 
leader, Mrs Delvln Walden,

KehekaiiA Uom Joint 
InAt/dlotim

District Deputy Henrietta 
ArmarongandTom Berry, Dis­
trict Grand Master of Mule- 
shoe, Installed officers In 
Mnleshoc Tuesday night for 
Frlona Oddfellows, Mulethoe 
Oddfellows and Rebekahs and 
Earth Rebekahs.

Those Inualled from Earth 
were Lucille Henderson, Noble 
Grand; Louise Galloway. Vice 
Grand: Pat Higgins, Junior Past 
Grand; Era Walker, secretary; 
Mary Parish, treasurer-. Midefle 
Simmons, chaplain; Henrietta 
Armstrong conductor Mildred 
Kendrick, right support to the 
noble grand; and Brenda Lack­

ey. Inside guardian.
A delicious salad supper and 

beautiful religious songs were 
enjoyed by the 75 members 
present.

Pft/iiq Line/

Mr. and M s W.A McCool. 
Mr. and Mis. W. L. Barton, 
Mrs Aimer Barton, Melvin 
Barton and Ed Halley were In 
A ma rlllo Tuesda y t o a ttend the 
funeral of Kenneth McCool. 
Burial was In the Springlake
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Cemetery. Kenneth was a to Central Plains General Hos- 
nephewofMrs. Barton and W. pltal In Plalnvlew January 4 
A McCool. with a bleeding ulcer. He Is

" 1 to have major surgery this
W. C. Maxcey was admitted week.

D E M O N S T R A T O R  S A L E
70 Model Pontiac, E ecurlve, 4-Dr. , Hardtop, Completely 
Loaded, Turquoise with Black Vinyl Top. Used Locally Only

70 Model Pontiac, LeMansCoupe, Red with Black Vinyl Top, 
6 ,842  Miles

70 Model Toyota. 4-Dr , Automatic Transmission, Radio, 
Air Conditioned. 9 ,140 M les

SAVE UP TO $1000 ON 1'HESE DEMOS 

CLEAN USED CARS

70 M"del C adillac, Sedan DeVllle, White with Vinyl 
Top, Completely Loaded. Local One Owner, 9 ,143  Miles 
SAVE A BUNCH1

69 Bonneville, 4 - Dr. , Hardtop. Beautiful Car. Fully Equip­
ped, Factory Warranty, $2 ,980 .00

71 Chevrolet Montlcello, Bronze with Brown Vinyl Top, 
2 ,360  M ies, SAVE $700

64 Impala, V8. Air Conditioning and Power, 41 ,700 Actual 
Miles, Nicest 64 Chevrolet In Texas

For The Best Results 
Apply

SOL-U-PHOS LIQUID 
FERTILIZER

And For
Faster And More Satisfactory Application

Of Your Fertilizers
LET US APPLY YOUR FERTILIZER

WITH OUR BIG A
DRYand LIQUID

FERTILIZER APPLICATORS
NOW  IS T H E  T IM E  I

__________T O  P LO W  Y O U R  F E R T I L I Z E R S

S A W YER  FER TILIZER  
and CHEM ICAL
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That First

by County Home Demonstra­
tion Agent

Tte annual friendship Day 
held by the Home Demotutta - 
tlon Club women In lamb 
County will be January 25 In 
the Willy Room of tne REA 
Building. Littlefield 

Beginning at 10:00 o'clock 
progra ins will be given by each 
of the clubs, Olton, Sptlng- 
lake, Sunny dale and Oklaho­
ma Avenue Presentaiiou of 
two Texas Home Demonstra­
tion Association pins will be 
nude and a salad luncheon will

he served during the noon hour 
Each woman is to bring a sal- 
a l.

At l  00 o'clock Miss Gina 
Sharp, Hemphill Wells Hash ion 
Coordinator will present a pro­
gram >n Fa si i Ions and M xJel-
fng.

Anyone Interested in this pro­
gram Is Invited to attend.

Friendship Day Has been ob­
served for a number of years 
by home dem mstratlon club 
women In Lamb County Pro­
grams have been those of an 
educational and informative 
nature.

M inimi F/tImjAa  5t*utq

MifChvtdi
Sprlngla I 
made bot

The
Friends made booklets entitl­
ed "My Church". Each boy 
and girl told what they liked 
to do best at church They 
chose Bible markers from the 
Bible and read verses.

Mrs. Bill Lunsford tea :her. 
read a story to them. Nora's

Favorite Puzzle
A Thank You Prayer was giv­

en.
Refreshments of brownies were 

served by M s Wayne Davis 
to M chael and Jerry Field, 
Diana Jones, Kelley Walden, 
MikeRamerlz Reggie Russell 
and Rocky Lunsford

(jynAunw t Edur/itim. ~To l$e,
LfEI T'WfM/n

Tne Sprlnglake-Earth C up­
turn! Young Homemakers will 
moat Tuesday, January 19. 
7;00 p m In the Homo 
Cottage on the S-E campus.

Lady Clare Phillips, home 
demonstration agent for Lamb

will give a program
r Ed

at
Ec

County,
on Consumer Education. 

Wives of the Sprlnglake- 
Earth Young Farmers are In­
vited to attend and any oilier 
Interested woman are wel­
come Refreshments will he 
served.

Er w r t jp JU ir j f t l  FfcfljfcXq W 5 f ! 5

The WSCS of the United 
M'. thodist Church met Tues­
day morning at 10 o'clock In 
the church.

Mrs Jo mule Williams was in
charge of the ptogtain "Tire 
Ecumenical Reality. " Site was 
assisted In the discussion by 
several members, emphasiz­
ing the Importance of unity 
and cooperativeness among an

the churches In order to pre- 
senta strong Christian from in 
the w.xld where so many pagan 
Influences seem to flourish 

Present ware Mis. Gladys 
Goodwin Mis Crill Bulls. 
Mis J a Littleton Jr. . Mrs. 
Ida Allen, M-'S. Rom Brock 
M’s. Kenneth Cowley, Mrs 
Jack Hinson Mrs. Ra\ Axtell. 
M’s Naomi Burgess md Mrs 
Johnnie Williams

Ttoop 30? Studi/a Tftbfft Sfittinq
Sprlngla kc Brownie Troop308 

met Mixiday afternoon and 
studied proper table setting 
Jhnior leaders Carle ie Jones 
and Kathy BIbby showed the 
correct way l« set a table. 
Each girl was then asked to do 
so. TTie Brownies were told to 
try table setting at home this

week.
Gaines were plaved by all 

the girts
Raraeahmanta of Ice cream 

bars ware rerve J  by Teresa
Lunsford to Lyn Howell Bev­
erly King. Cretla James Les- 
la Templetoii and leaders. 
Cirienc Jones and Kathy Bib-
» y .

LOOK CHANNEL MASTER 

5 YEAR WARRANTY ON 

PICTURE TUBE IS HERE

TH E C H A N N EL MASTER  
A U T O C O L O R  C IR C U IT
tor fh# tmeM ns color tk* Channel 
Master Autorolor Circsist includes 
Automatic fin e Tuning that guaran­
tees pit lure sharpness and clarity and 
corrects manual tuning errors even 
when channels are changed Ire 
que-itlv

Automatic Gain Control keys con 
slstent picture quehtv and Color Trak 
mat stains definition as brightness is 
adit sled Magnetic interference that 
causes color smear is eliminated hv 
A utom atic  D egau ssin g , and the 
Instant-On Circuit snaps perfect p ic­
tures nghi to life '

THIS SET
REG. $779 95 

FOR

*625®°
WITH TRADE

Only C abin et  With Wood And Wood 
V e n e e r  no P l a s t i c ,

YOUR NEW CHANNELMASTER D EA LER  

S A L E S ----------------------------- SER V IC E

S E L L  T H E  B E S T  - S E R V I C E  THE R E S T

KEN’S T.Y. APPLIANCE
711 H A LL AVEN UE PHONE 38^ 3777 

L IT T L E F IE L D , TEXA S,

January 5S-22

MONDAY
Turkey. Dressing w/Gravy 
Cranberry Sauce 
CaudleJ Yam* w 'Markhmall- 

ows
Green Beans 
Chilled Fruit 
Hot Rolls, Butter Milk

TUESDAY 
Frlto Pie 
Spanish Rice 
Combination Salad 
Lemon Chiffon Pie 
Coruhread, t  tickers. Milk

WEDNESDAY 
Pinto Beans w/Ham 
Buttered Spinach 
Potato Salad 
Peach Cobbler 
Corubread Butter. Milk

THURSDAY 
Baked Hain 
AuGratln Potatoes 
ik-.d Devil Cabbage Slaw 
Raisin Pie
Hot Rolls, Butter, Milk

FRIDA Y 
Beef Stew
B dogua Smdwlc es 
Celery Sticks 
Strawacny Shortcake 
Crackers and M lk

Lamb Marriages Long Lasting
This year Is a special year 

for couples In Lamb Count). 
That Is. it's special In the reuse 
that many will be celebrating 
tlielr Silver Anniversary this 
year. Of the 5 ,860  oi so mar­
ried couples in La nh County 
an estimated 250 will be mark­
ing their 25th year together.

"Hiere Isa reason for tills sud-
It all goes back

» ye
War II ended At that tim e,

den increase It all gc 
to 1946. the year after World

WALKING presents a problem when a child has been born 
with an open spine But Norman Proctor, 3. of Salt Lake City. 
Utah, is hnding the help he needs at (he March of Dimes 
Birth Defects Center at Primary Children's Hospital Skilled 
professionals, such as physical therapy aide Charles H 
Vought. make it a lot easier lor a little boy who wants to learn 
The voluntary health organization helps support medical 
services, research and professional and public health educa­
tion aimed at prevention and treatment ot birth defects

EumdAlup 55 Ct/iA\ FoA Lunckp/w,

the martial floodgates opened 
wide, with more people taking 
tlielr nuptial vows than in any 
other year, before ot since

No fewer than 2 ,300 .000  
couples were married In the 
United Stales that year, 37 per 
cent more than Ip the previous 
year. Now, 25 years later, 
nearly 2 .000 .000  of them— 
the ones who have managed (o 
avoid death and dlvorce—are 
approaching their sliver anni­
versaries.

According to the findings of 
insurance company statisti­
cian*. hated upon data t-ken 
from their own records and 
from government sources, des­

pite tlte rite III the divorce 
rate tire majority of couplet
can count on more than 25 
years of marriage.

For today's newly weds In 
Lamb County, If they are In 
tlielr early 20 't, the chances 
are better tnan 8 out of 10 that 
they will be living together to 
celebrate tlielr silver anniver­
saries.

Even for those who marry In 
their early 30 s. the chances 
are 7 out of 10. based oil the 
national average

As for golden anniversaries.
the odds In lavot ot a couple 
reaching that landmark arc 
twice as good as they were 50 
years ago. thanks to the great 
medical advances since tTien.

For a 21-ycar-old man who 
marries a girl of 17 or '8 .  the 
odds are nearly 2 out of 5 at 
the present tim e, according 
to the statisticians.

Government figures Indicate 
that. In Lamh County, |«ople 
tend to get married young and 
to remain married for a long 
time.

They show 74 percent of the

men and women over age 14 to 
be married, a comparatively 
high proportion.

Elsewlnste In the United 
States, the average Is 67 per­
cent In the West South Cen - 
tral States, It IS 69 percent

AMONG TH OSE 
WHO A R E  I L L

Joey Cornett, son of Mi. and 
Mrs Johnny Cornett, was re­
leased from South Plains Hos­
pital In Amherst Monday. He 
wjsadmlttedSaturday with an 
asthma attack

Mrs. Rayhern Ott was admit­
ted Friday to Methodist Hos­
pital with a broken leg receiv­
ed In a skiing accident.

Mrs. Ada (Rudd) Evltt had 
thyroid surgery Monday In tlie 
Methodist Hospital In Lubbock. 
Her room number Is 706 B. 
Mrs Evltt it wall known In 
Earth having lived here many 
years prior to moving to Clo­
vis. New Mexico.

We wish to thank our truny 
wiHiJerful friends and neigh­
bors for their many kindnesses, 
beautiful flower* and visits 
during my recent Illness and 
a special thanks to Hershel 
Hulcy and ton. alio, David 
Hartman, out minister, and 
Cecil Slover

M>iv Cod bless you and also 
our senior citizens for food and 
the signed card. We love Earth 
and Its wonderful people

Frank Butter and Family

The flower*, cards vlslta- 
tlosia and phone calls were 
deeply appreciated during my 
hospitalization. Yourthought- 
fuluess will be remembered.

Thank You 
Otble Armstrong

The Friendship Sunday School 
class of tlie Methodist Church 
met for their 1 o'clock lunch­
eon In the home of Mrs. Jack 
Hinson on Tuesday.
After much dining and fellow­

ship a devotional titled Small 
Talk was given by M t. Hin­
son,
Gaines of 84 then followed 

Those enjoying the occasion 
were Mrs EJ 1th Brocket'e, 
Mrs Ida Allen M't. Hornet 
Sanders, M't. Beuia Coker, 
Mis. Naomi Burgess Mrs. Lot­
tie O’leg. Mis May Hamil­

ton, Mrs Crill Bulls, Mis Ray 
Axtell, Mrs Bessie Cearley, 
Mis. Gladys Goodwin. M't. 
Johnnie Williams, Mrs. John 
Welch, M ts Ruby Jones and 
the hostess.

Pa/ily L iliLC/

Rev. Johnnie Willis ms left 
Monday to attend the North­
west TexasConference Retreat 
at Ceta Canyon on evangellsm 
He returned Wednesday.

Financia l
Facts

I M i 3y W illn A. Hawkins, Jr .

Have you written a will? It it an up-to-date will?
Whan you name the bank at your executor, knowledge

accumulated from years of prac- ----------------------------------------------
tscal experience la brought to r VKcrcwta 
beer « i  every aspect of your will, Admi rust rating trusts is a full-
nxmirtng your beneficiaries of lm- um e  fur Uw bank Trust
rrwxRato. efficient action. Pfpartment.

' l l ,  you had an opin­
ion would it be for or against 
the -o b ject mentioned?

Main duties of the executor 
are to asarmbtr the propelty. 
manage it; pay the debts, taxes, 
anrl /wlmintatnitian expenses; dis­
tribute wtiM Is left recording to 
the terms of the will; and ac­
count to the probate court fur 
whit has been dene

Assets entrusted to tlie Trust 
Department are kept separate 
from other banking assets and 
the property of each trust is kept 
separate from that of ell other 
tru.ts Strict and regular auditing 
by independent auditors and slate 
and federal examiners safeguards

WATCH NEXT WEEK TOR 
•MAXI KK CHARGE CARD"

Support tire Wolverines and 
Wolverenes, attend all their 
remaining games at home and 
away

Whet’rer you are Interested In
saving money— ot borrowing 
we are m >st accommodating at 
CITIZENS STATE BANK. 
Whatever your needs from it, 
we'll be happy to serve And 
you’ll enjoy our friendly at­
mosphere. Visit us today,CIT­
IZENS STATE BANK. Phone 
257-3451.Open dally 9 till 3

S T A T E M E N T  O F

Assets
M o r t a g e  Loans and Other  
Liens on R e a l  E s t a t e

C O N D I T I O N
A F T E R  TH E  C L O S E  O F  B U S I N E S S  D E C E M B E R  31, 1970

Liabilities And Net Worth:
Savin gs  Ac counts

All O th er  Loans.

$ 1 0 , 0 0 6 .  7 2 2 .  

_____ 2 5 5 ,  420.

$12, 4 3 8 ,  618,

A d van ces  f r o m  F e d e r a l  
Home Loan B a n k .NONE

R e a l  E s t a t e  Owned and 
in Ju d g e m e n t____________ 100, 186.

Loans and C o n t r a c t s  Made to 
F a c i l i t a t e  Sa le  Of Real  
E s t a t e ___________________________

O t h e r  B o r r o w e d  Money_

Loans  In P r o c e s s _______

O t h e r  L i a b i l i t i e s

.NONE

.NONE

.155, 7 4 8 .

C ash  on Hand and in B an ks .
S p e c i f i c  R e s e r v e s .

.150,  9 9 8 .

In v e s t m e n t s  and S e c u r i t i e s .

F ix ed  A s s e t s  
L e s s  D e p r e c i a t i o n .

2 , 4 0 8 , 6 0 5 .  

____ 7 5 , 8 6 8 .

G e n e r a l  R e s e r v e s  

Su r p lu s ________________

$ 6 5 8 ,  789 

$ 2 9 7 , 8 0 5 .

7 4 , 6 3 4 .

- 1 2 ,  0 0 0 .

9 5 6 , 5 9 4 .

D e f e r r e d  C h a r g e s  and Oth er  
A s s e t s __________________________ .328,  2 9 9 .

Tota l  A s s e t s . . .  $13, 481, 8 4 6 . Total  L i a b i l i t i e s  and Net Worth

O K M O K S :
Hoyd Coffman, President 
Huger L  Jones.

txerutne V ice President 
hank Huger*. V r e »’reredent 
'la ri lain Ihaxlon, Secretary 
Hetty Mellon. Treasurer 
Jerome Kirby. Attorney

Littlefield Federal 
Savings & Loan 

Association
301 XIT  D R I V E  L I T T L E F I E L D .  T E X A S

$13, 481, 8 4 6 .

DIRECTORS: 
Hoyd Coffman 
Roger I .  Jones 
frank Rogers 
Jerome Kirby 
Don IteJI 
J.M. farmer 
Kenneth K are

I
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L a . teay » 1
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Lee 

Parson and family of Bovina 
ipent New Year's Day with 
Mr and Mrs. Thomas Parson 
and their guests.

Mr. and Mrs. David Sadler 
and Melody of Lubbock came 
In Thursday night to spend the 
New Year holidays here and at 
Hereford. They and Mi. and 
Mrs. Larry Sadler and girls, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Powell and 
children of Dlmmltt and Mis. 
Pearl Sadler of Dlmmltt spent 
New Year's D-y with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ezell Sadler. Mrs. Pearl 
Sadler also spent the night.

Mr. and M s. Jack Srepliens 
and boys of Petersburg were 
with the C ecil Curtis family 
during his surgery on Tuesday. 
He was dismissed S-turday and 
Mr. and Mrs. Stephens, Mr. 
and Mrs. Don Curtis and Cyn­
thia ofEarth visited with tliem 
and Debbie who has been home 
from San Angelo University 
for the holidays.

Mrs. J Paul Waggoner and 
Mis. Roy Lllley of Dim nltt 
visited last Saturday In Lub­
bock with Mr and Mrs. John­
ny Armstrong and in Hale Cen­
ter Hospital with Mrs. Hubert 
Lllley.

Word was received here Sun­
day morning that Mrs. Goble 
Armstrong of Clovis, New 
Mexico, passed away In a Clo­
vis hospital of a heart attack 
Saturday night. She is an aunt 
of Noble and Orble Armstrong. 
The Noble Armstrongs visited 
the family In Clovis last Sun-

Steve Jackson and Beverly 
Gay Chick of Denison were 
married In Denison Saturday. 
January 2 They are both Tech 
students.

Kelly Haydon and Lee Brown 
were on the Sprlngla ke-Earth 
" B" honor roll for the 7th gra de 
the second six weeks. David 
Carr was on the same roll for 
the 8th grade.

The Sprlngla ke -Earth 8th 
grade boys defeated Farwell 
Monday night 34-33. Dickie 
Bradley got 10 points and Ed­
win Fulfer 2 The 7th grade 
boys won 30-12. Lee Brown 
made 4 points
The Wolverenes lost to Far- 

well Tuesday 40-43. Janls 
Bridge made 1 point. Tlte 
girls B team lost 28-16. Lesa 
Morgan tied with Darlene Sul- 
scroTEarth for high point with 
4 points each. Dianne Fulfer 
made 2 points.

CCVUSCTlON; An article In 
the Sunnyslde Newt was rattier 
confusing to those who take 
the Castro County News re­
garding a death, and the Par­
son family lan week. The ar­
ticle read Edwin and Phillip 
Parson of Plalnvlew came 
home with their grandparents 
Monday to spend the week with 
them James and Debbie Fitz­
gerald have spent most of the 
week with them while their 
mother is In the Plaint Me­
morial Hospital. An Infant 
brother was burled In Dlmmltt 
Wednesday afternoon. Rev. 
Mack Turner had charge of tlte 

The Goble graveside rites. They live near

FO R THOUSANDS O F  
YEARS, A S/PE FROM  SUN - 

L/GHT, MAN HAP TO 
PEPEN P UPON L/GHT 
FROM A FLA M E TO S E E ...THOMAS A gV ISO N  

NAS BORN ABB / /. 184 T, 
124 YEARS A G O ...

I f f l f N  E P /S O N
INVENTEP THE /N CAN PES ■
CENT "LIGHT BULB"/N 1879,
P E O P IE  H AP NO NAY TO U S E  IT/N THE/R HOMES. 
/N  3  Y EA R S, H IS /NVENT/VE GENIUS BROUGHT 
THE F/RST ELECTRIC POW ER COMPANY INTO 
OPERATION IN NEW YORK C IT Y  O B B 2).

N£*¥ FACTS OF l/GHT.
l*$EG/NN/NO JANUARY EE, /97/, 

th e FEPERA L TRAPE COMMISSION  
REQ UIRES ALL HO USEH O iP LIGHT 
BULBS TO B E  LA B LEP  WITH 3
r a t in g s  t o  e n l ig h t e n  t h e p u Bl /c .
w a t t s :
L U M E N S :  
B U I  a  i / F E :

ELECTRICITY U SEP ... 
LIGHT OUTPUT... 
LIFE EXPECTANCY...

• -
with her folks in Fort Worth. 
Tlte Paytes and Vlvlllne left 
Monday, the 28th.

Mr. and Mis Ellis Carter of 
Hereford and Mi. and Mrs. 
Dave Gilley of Amarillo spent

New Year's Dsy with Mr. and 
Mrs. Edd Duke and also the 
Robert Dukes.

Mrs John Gilbreath has vis­
ited teversl times this week 
with Iter mother, Mrs. D. A. 
Barnette of Olton, In West 
Texss Hospital In Lubbock.
Mr. and Mrs. Frsncls King of 

Amarillo brought Mrs. Irving 
Klnghotne Wednesday after an 
extended visit there 

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Duke, Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Duke and Bob 
Duke attended the 85th birth­
day celebration of Mrs. L D. 
Winders ofEarth last Sunday. 

Bob Duke attended tlte Youth 
Convocation on M nlstries In 
Lubbocktlie 29th and 30th. He 
attended a Speech Tournament 
In Frlotu Saturday.

Mrs Hjhert Lllley was dis­
missed from the Hale Center 
Hospital Friday but will stay 
there a few days In the home 
ofher daughter. Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Powers and Dondl until 
she gains some strength.

Mrs. Gamer Ball was admit­
ted to the Littlefield Hospital 
Friday after passing out lit feer 
home. She ha d been having 
severe headscltes, but thought 
they were caused from an ear 
Infection which hat had her 
down all week.

Robert Duke. Bob and Larry 
and Cobv and Mutt Gilbreath 
attended the Flagg 4-H Club 
last Friday night. New officers 
wore elected. Larry wit e lect­
ed council delegate, Coby the 
alternate council delegate. 

Bob Duke played In me FFA 
donkey basketball game at 
Dlmmltt Tnursday night. 
Captain and Mrs. Kenny Ak­

ers and children left M mday

fot a California vacation be­
fore returnlii^to his hate at 
K. I. Sawyer Air Force Base. 
He It tie  grandson of Mr. and
M's John Spencer.

Mi and Mrs. James Howell 
and children of Dim nltt visit­
ed Sunday afternoon and had 
supper Sunday night with Mr. 
and Mrs Ezell Sadler

Forty-nine attended Sunday 
School with 24 In Training 
Union Sunday night Mis Doug 
Loudder Is teaching die 2 and 
3 year old! Animal Friends" 
for the January Bible Study, 
Mrs. Larry Sadler 'Friends 
Who Help Us" to beginners 
Mr, and Mrs. Mirk Wysong 
are teaching the children 
' S.nglng Praises", Mr. and 
Mrs Bill Morgan "Music In 
Bible Times. “

Mi and Mis. Larry Sadler, 
Carrie. Stacey and Laura spent

tlte day Sunday with Mr and 
Mrs TexConardandJuanelle

p o ^  L iUL&

Mis. H C. Martin returned 
home Thursday from South 
Plains Hospital in Amlierst.

Mrs. Jerry Schultz of Phoe­
nix. Arizona. and Pete Schupp 
of Albuquerque, New Mexico, 
left tlieir parent's home, Mr,
andMrs Frank Butler of Earth.
Sunday. Tliey have been with 
their parents since December 
20.

TELEX
Hearing Aids

Clovis Hearing Aid Center
Batteries & Molds. Free Tests. 

Service All Makes.
416 Mitchell Phone  7 63 -6900

Clovis, N .M .

day afternoon. The Goole graveside rites. They live near 
Armstrongs are fotmer residents Flagg. The article read In the 
of tlte community.

Orble Armstrong underwent 
surgery on the nerve In an arm 
In Methodist Hospital last 
Thursday.

Rev. and Mrs. Ellis Parson 
and family came for their 
children Sunday and attended 
the morning worship services 
with his patents, Mr and Mts. 
Thomas Parson.

Forty-five attended Sunday 
School with 12 In Training 
Union last Sunday In spite of 
the blowing snow and neat zero 
temperatures.

Mr. and Mis. Noble Arm­
strong, Mr. and Mrs. Mllburn 
Haydon, and Mis. Alton Loud- 
dzr attended the funeral ser-

Castro County News "Edwin 
and Phillip Parson of Plalnvlew 
came home with their grand­
parents Monday to spend the 
week with tliem, while their 
mother Is In the Plains Me­
morial Hospital. An Infant 
brother was Hurled In Dlmmltt 
Wednesday afternoon. Rev. 
Mack Turner had charge of t l *  

live near 
This made It sound 

as though the Parsons had lost 
an Infant grandson Instead of 
the Fitzgeralds losing a son, 
and the Parsons have had sev­
eral calls about It. Everyone 
makes mistakes but this was a- 
had one to make.

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Brad-

graveslde rites. They 
Flag

vices of Mrs. Goble Armstrong ley took her parents. Mi. and 
In Clovis M o n d ay  afternoon. Mrs. Elmer Dixon, to Tennes- 

came down see Friday fot a short vacation
trie

Mrs. Armstrong 
with the flu afterward.

The book "Doctor In an Old 
World' was placed In the l i ­
brary of the Sunnyslde Baptist 
Church In memory of K*a. 
Goble Armstrong this week by 
Mi. and Mrs L. B. Bowden.

Ray Joz Riley apoke to the 
Sunnyslde Lions Club on Nar­
row Row Cotton Planting In 

their regular meeting Monday 
night.

Mission Friends, Crusaders 
Girls In Action and Acteens 
met at the church Tuesday 
afternoon to begin a new year 
In their work

Mi. and Mrs. J Paul Wag­
goner visited in the Hile Cen­
ter Hospital with Mrs. Hubert 
Lllley Tuesday night.

Mi andMrs Boh Ball of Ol­
ton visited Wednesday with 
Mr. andMrs Garner Bail Mis. 
G >rner Ball has been quite 111 
all week hut at home. Several 
have had a flu-like virus here 
the last two weeks.

The WMS met for the general 
m.-etlng Wednesday night with 
a good attendance. Tiie pro­
gram wascut down 30 minutes 
In order to start the January 
Bible Study of the Epistles of 
John. The adults will he study­
ing "The Letters of John' from 
7:00-8:00 each Wednesday 
night through February 3 The 
age level departments will 
have tlieir hooks on Sunday 
nights during this period. Rev. 
Mack Turner Is teaching the 
adults.

The church exceeded its Lot­
tie Moon c'orciga Mission goal 
of $775 in December.

Orble Armstrong was dismiss­
ed from Methodist Hospital in 
Lubbock Tuesday He won't 
have surgery on the other arm 
In the foreseeable future.
Roy Phelan cut a finger on a 

can Thursday morning and 
couldn't stop the bleeding so 
had to go to the doctor In tlie 
afternoon w.iere five stitches 
corrected the problem

2
and

and Mis. 
family. Mi

Robert Duke 
and Mrs.

Wyndel Payte .and family of 
Big Springs, Mrs. Vlvlflne 
Duke of Big Springs liad Christ­
inas dinner with Mr. and Mrs.
Edd Duke Christmas Eve. The 
Robert Dukes left Christmas 
Day and stayed until the 28th

L E A V E  TH E WORRY TO  U S . . .

INCOME T A X  SERVICE 
and BOOKKEEPING

For Farmers, Individuals and Business 
Returns

• 5 :30  M o n d a y - F r i d a y  
1-1 2 :00  Noon Saturday

COPY MACHINE SERVICE 
A V A ILA B LE

-C a ll or S e s -

Mary and Robert Dennis
311 E.  8th (One B lock  E a s t  Of Post  Of f i ce)  
Of f ice  Phone 2 8 5 -  2 7 6 8  or  2 8 5 - 2 2 9 8 Olton

When Something New &Good Is Manufactured, 

A Farmer SHOULD Investigate, Before Buying The 

Old Product.

BADGER PLOW
IS S O M ET H IN G  D IF F E R E N T !

IT 'S  G R E A T !
See Them At

Brownd-Jordan Equipment
In Ear th

Roll A-Cone Badger plows are designed for 
maximum strength and versatility They are 
light in weight, yet strong enough for the 
largest farming need The specially designed 
shank holders tie the bars together adding 
extra strength where needed

With this basic frame you can build any 
type plow you may need -  there are at 
many possibilities as there are farmers The 
basic frame is available in sizes from 14 ft. 
to 28 ft

Why 90 10 the lieM  with leu  then the beet

BADGER PLOWS

MANUFACTURING 
& DISTRIBUTING CO

Phone 806  668 2410 
Bon 76 Tulie Texei

See Vour Deeier 
Or Contact Us

C A R P E T

ALL &YLON FACE
$ 5 . 9 5  P e r  Sq.
Installed Over Sponge Rubber
Pad

C L E A R A N C E  S A L E  
Group Two 
ALL NYLON FACE 
$ 6 . 9 5  P e r  Sq.

Installed Over Sponge Rubber I 
Pad 1

Yd. Yd.

Many Outstanding Values Throughout Store

805 Broadway Plalnvlew 296-2761

FOR S A L E
Good Used Aluminum Pipe In S iz e s  F r o m  
4 "  thru 8 " ,  Also  Good A s s o r t m e n t  Of 
All Kinds Of Used F i t t i n g s . , .  New S y s t e m  
Of All T y p e s ,  We Will Buy Or T r a d e  
F o r  Your Used Aluminum P ip e .

STATE. LIN E IRRIGATION CO. Inc.
IR R IG A T IO N  S Y S T E M S

385-448 7 -Little fie Id 272- 3460-Muleshoe

FOR SALE; 2 living room, 
suites in somI condlti >n. C all' 
257-3967 after 5:30 p. tn or 
257-2145

FORSALE: Nine City lots south 
ofEarth Elevator, contact C it­
izens State Bank In Earth.

1/18/tfc

AfRRENT-T wo bedroom house, 
carport, utility room. $50 per 
month. Phone 257-3821.

__________________ 6/BAfc
FOR SALE MISCELLANEOUS: 
"Take over payments on 1968 
Singer sewing machine in wal­
nut console. Will zig-zag. 
blindhem, fancy patterns, etc, 
Assume 3 payments st $7.96. 
Write Credit Manager, 1114 
19th Street, Lubbock, Texas.

2/19/tfc

4*E a r t h  Lodge 
No. 127 7

Got
You c

a BIG molt 
LITTLE MONEY? 
your mortgage ifthe unexnect- 

■«e R. J. ”s l*e t-

and a
can pay

A. F .  & A. M. 
R e g u la r  Meeting 

Night
Second Th ursday

Ea ch  Month 
L. K. Anderson-W M 
[>>n Clayton-Secretary

ed happens 
•r" Brock, 11/19/tfc

IN SURANCE
Horne-Auto-Life 
Blue Cross

F A R M  B U R E A U  
IN SURANCE 

Companies

E D  JE NNIN GS
Offlce-385-3444 
Home-386-5012 
Littlefield, Texas

■ n Q u H

OLTON MUSIC CENTER 
L. W. Veneable 
404 Main Street 

•Guitar* •Drums 
•Amplifiers t  Arcea- 

h  a or lea 
•sheet Music 

Wo WlU Give
MUSIC LESSONS 

Como by 8 vtsitll 
No at door to 

Community d in k

Cesspools Drilled 

Coptic Tanks Pumped, 

Pierholes and Boots

BROWN DRILLING CO.
3 6 4 - 0 2 6 0  H e r e f o r d  3 6 4 - 3 1 6 0

FOR SALE Brick. 3 bedroom,
1 3/4 bath, separate living 
room den with fireplace.
5 3/RH> loan. Hits Park.
257- 2 ' 87. 1 ' 4/2tp

INCOME TAX returns prepar­
ed after 5:00 and Saturday. 
Call Mrs Wilton Lewis, 251- 
3333, East Highway 70 Earth.

_______1 14 /4t c •

TO SETTLE ESTATE

Business property for sale In 
Sprlngla ke Post Office build­
ing Aim grocery store build

A P P U A N C E  AND
E L E C T R I C A L

R E P A I R

L O V E L E S S
A P P L I N A C E

Olton 285-2000 or 285-3366 
We Are AtClose Aa Your T ele ­
phone. Sales And Service On 
Alt Conditioning Units.

FOR SALE: Throe bedroom, 
stucco house on 75’ x 140* 
corner lot in Earth. Double 
garage with 10* x 20' room at­
tached. Good storm cellar. 
Lawrence Sloan. Krea., Texas.

12/17/4tc

I,ng and 
MB- 2091.

fixtures. Call
l/7/4tc

FOR EXPERT CUSTOM FARM 
WORK: deep chiseling, Tref- 
lanlng. lifting and planting, 
contact Earl kollar Phone
966-7976. l/4/3tp

HOU9 FDR SALE 3 bedroom 
brick, all electric built-Ins, 
fenced berk yard Phone 267- 
2170. 1/14/fec

FOR SALE-Sewing Machines. 
We are frenchlw deelen for 
Singer, Necchl, Nelco end 
Good Houmkeeper. W* repair 
eny make Sclison and pink­
ing (heart sharpened, CalJ 
272 - 3030 In Mule duft, Texes. 
Harvey Bets Appliance.

FDR SALE: Eight room mod­
ern home, recently redecora­
ted with new carpeting, new 
wall furnace, paneling and 
accouatlcalceilli.'v 1 an 
3937 or 257-2145

BUSINESS and INDUSTRIAL
£ i DIRECTORY m
F E E D E R S  

C R A IN ,IN C .  
DAILY B U Y E R S  
FOR C A T T L E  

F E E D E R S  
F e d e r a l  Storage 
L icense 3-4451 

We Can Use 
Your C ra in  

SUDAN L IV E ST O C K  
and FEED IN G CO. 

Phone 227 -5 3 2 1  
Sudan

"Your BUICK 
OLDSMOB1 LE  

DEA1.ER

EXCHANGED 
IlMINUTI SERVICE

McCORMCirS
AUTO SUPPLY

t r im ns h o p
RHONE SI8-4MS

^ J L J T T U F I J E l j j J ^

E A R T H  NEWS-SUN

B R O C K  MOTOR 
Muleahoe,  TrxaZ

J O B
PRINTING

EARTH NEWS

MCNUMNTS

Winnaboro Blue Granite 
White Geargie Marble

and othefs
Including Bronze for 

Memorial Park 
Sped fleet Iona

See ot Call Collect 
Percy Parson, Olton 
Phone 285-2621 ar 285-2767 
Prank Ellis, Muleahoe 
272-4572

le Reef Altered
f l f i l j

9 8

Protect ;»i
F I R S T  S T A T E  BANK 

Dim mitt .  Texas

HAMMONS

~U NER AL HOME

Ambulance S e r v ic e

Phone 385-5 12 1

U T T L E  F I E L D  
T E X A S

\
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Den 1 Discusses January Theme
Cub Scout Den 1 discussed 

the theme for January, " Lights 
In the Shy ” Tiie boyi Identi­
fied cunite 1 latluni and told 
where they were In the iky. 
Theboyi are to lave cancel­

led stamps from envelope! 
Each damp will buy a glass of 
milk for an underprivileged 
child.

Ty Harber. denner. led the 
Pledge of Allegiance and A- 
merlca

Greg Welch led the boys In 
outdoor garnet which were 
M onkeylnaClrcle and Chaie

ev i 
inside.

ting w 
the Living Circle 

Refreshment! of Snack Packi 
and cooklet were lerved to 
Rex Fennell Ty Harber, Andy 
Hartman. Dave Allen Ingram 
Nathan Ingram Loren Taylor. 
Den Chief Greg Welch, and 
Den Mothers, Mri. Don Tay­
lor and Mil. Nathaniel in- 
gram

Andy Hartman transferred to 
Den 3.

I t
v U i ,

S I  I
" 3 5

Den 3 Has Stamp Project
Cub Scout Den 3 met Wed- 

neaday, January 6, and dis­
cussed a stamp project The 
boys will save all postal stampt 
Eachitampwlll buy a child In 
Germany a glass of milk.

The den answered roll call 
by telling one of the things 
they enjoyed most about the 
holidays and then they dls 
cussed achievements.

Greg Gelssler was elected 
new denner with Bryan Smith 
assisting.

DenChlef. Brian Taylor, led 
the boy* In two a*1--'**-* 
"Johnny Mixup 

Refreshments of peanuts and 
hot chocolate were served ro 
Ricky Higgins, Kyle Kelley 
Lonnie Nelnast. Mike Wim­
berly, Glen Hausmann, Jim ­
my Robbins, Rodney Davis, 
Greg Gelssler, Bryan Smith. 
Den Chief Brian Taylor, and 
leaders, Mrs. Phil Ncianst and 
Mrs Don Taylor

¥ V r

pQ/tXq Liita
Mis Wanda zanders, a pat­

ient In t ie Methodist Hospital 
In Lubbock for the past four

weeks, was reported to he much 
improved Wednesday after­
noon She has been feeling 
better for the past week, then
Monday she was permitted to 
be up and walking around

WOLVERETTES L O S TO KRESS 33-29---K aren  Armstrong, No. 42, made two points Janet 
Britton. 5 and the Banks twins. Jenna and Jtm.ua, tied for high point honors with 11 points

You can’t afford to ignore
SHAKES a n d  #y

lik e  this

• F o r  y o u r  t i r e s ’ s a k e
• F o r  s a f e t y ’s s a k e

HUNTERl e t  us n  w n  i  f c n  >
B A L A N C E  Y O U R  W H E E L S

a n d  y o u ' l l  d r i v e  w

s m o o t h l y
l i k e  t h i s

PLAINS ALTO PARTS
^Across From Cathway)

South Main MULESHOE Phoro 777-4576

Wolverines Lose To Hart 2 6 -3 5
The Springlake-Earth Wol­

verines lost out to Han Friday 
26-35. ’

The Wolverines were behind 
after the second quarter 9-21. 
Third quarter score was 14-26 

Scoring for rhe Wolverines 
were Donnie Galloway and 
Brian Sanderson. 6; Hoyt 
Glasscock and Larry Thomas, 
4 Mike Cleavlnger, 3; Carl 
Sulser, 2, andCreg Slover, 1

WOLVERINES PLAY KRESS 
The S-E Wolverines played 

Kxess Tuesday and beat them 
In a close game 70-69 

The score at half time was 
S-E 34 and Kress 27.

Scoring for the Wolverines 
" ire  Mike Cleavlnger, 20 
Larry Thomas and Hoyt Glass­
cock, u  Greg Slover, 10 
David Bridlev. 8. Brian San­
derson. 6; and Carl Sulser. 4

WOLVERETTES LOSE 
CLOSE ONE

The Springlake-Earth Wol­
verenes lost i  close one to 
Hart Friday 45-46.

At half time the score was 
18-24
Jlmma Banks had high points 

scoring 21.
Others scoring were Jsnet

Britton, 13. and Jenna Banks. 
11.

KRESS DOWNS 
WOLVERETTES 33-29 

The S-E Wolverenes were 
downed by Kress 33-29.

At half tim e the score was 
Wolverenes. 16, Kress, 17 

Scoring for the Wolverenes 
were Jenna and Jim na Banks. 
11 points: Janet Brlnon. 5 
and Karen Armstrong. 2

BOYS B TEAM 
BEATS KRESS

The Junior Wolverine B Team 
played Tuesday night and heat 
Kress 43-38

Halftime score was S-E, 24, 
KreH. 14

Scoring for the S-E team 
wore Guy Davis, 15; C liff 
Wood. 8; Bob Angeley and 
Monty Price, 0 Kevin Ander­
son, Bob Cleavlnger, Don 
Brlnon and Randy Henderson, 
2.

Funeral Services Held Tuesday 
For K in  Of Area Residents

Funeral services for Kenneth 
McCool, 35, of Amarillo were 
field at 10:30 a. m Tuesday 
InBoxwellBrothers Ivy Chapel 
In Amarillo with Lynn andCur- 
tls Camp of the Bell Avenue 
Church of Christ officiating.

McCool died Sunday In the 
VA Hospital In Houston. 

Graveside services were at 
2 p. m at the Sprlnglake 
Cemetery In Sprlnglake.

McCool' moved to Amarillo 
five years ago from Muleshoe 
Hr was a native of Sllvenon. 
He was employed as s milk

processor for Hazlewood Dairy 
and was a member of the Bell 
Avenue Church of Christ He 
was an Army veteran of the 
Korean War.

Surviving are his wife, Betty 
Lou. three sons. Mark Elton. 
Michael Anthony and Kennle 
Lynn and a Jaughter, Laura 
Ann, all of the home; his 
mother. Mi*. Callle Mae Mc­
Cool of Muleshoe-, and three 
borthers, M alcolm  of C lovis, 
Donalds. of Austin and George 
O. of Newton Center, Mass.

UNLESS YOU'VE GOT A 
HORN OF PLENTY. . .

You’d b* wise to think about setting something 
aside to take ears of that ’ ’ rainy d ay" ahead.

Vary few of us era so fortunata that wa navar 
have to give a thought to the future. Most people 
know that if they want security, they are going to 
have fo provide for if themselves. That’s why they 
coma to us . . . for a savings program that helps them 
plan for a plentiful tomorrow.

DEPOSITS BY THE I Oth EARN FROM THE 1st
o

RIGHT NOW . . .  IS THE TIME 
TO COME TALK TO US ABOUT 
OWNING YOUR OWN HOME!

YOU DESERVE TO 8E A HOME OWNER!

H A L E /C O U N T Y
'C tT £ J S

a p l a i n v i i w ,  T e x a s

G R A D Y  l  BO YD . President 
Ground Floor Skaggs Building —  7th And Broadway

CORN
5  101 Cans I*® A N° ’ ' ' U  1 0 0Cans

Pineapple
Tidbits

No. 1 1/2 
Cana

] 0 0

Tomato
Juice

46 Oz.  Can 390

]00

FR E E
28  O * .  Bot t le  

F r o s t e e  Root B e e r  
With C a r to n  King Siz<

Dr. Pepper
9 0  Plu s Depos it

White

P O T A T O ES

20 Lb.  Bag 790

SPINACH
4  30 3 Cans J 0 0

Tomatoes
4  303 Cans

Mixed
Vegetables

S 103 Cans  i

Tomato
Sauce

11 8 o z .  Can

G*

. I " 0

B O LO G N A Lb. 4 9 0

Yellow

ONIONS

j i m m ,  s a u s a u e  2  i * -  1 J I
...... . ° -----------------------------

Lb. 15t

Pork Steak

T e x a s  Ruby Red

Grapefruit

7ViC Each

PRICES GOOD JANUARY 14 through JANUARY 20
WE GIVE SAH GREEN STAMPS DOUBLE ON TUESDAY AND WEDNESDAY1

EARTH SUPER SAVE

PLAY

GET 100 
BONUS STAMPS

4 4 « 4 *  *  4 « *  * A « «« * • t •> % 4, *  % * i J4.A. B A I  A. A •


