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1989 Homecoming 
Speaker Is Bob Cox 

Fire School Lessons Will Be Shared 'Cats Look Good in Scrimmage 

touchdown in scrimmage against Baird Friday. Interception and 

Department welcomes 
anyone who wishes to attend 
the monthly meetings each 
first Thursday at the fire sta-
tion about 6 p.m. Manpower, 
equipment and donations are 
always needed to keep a 
volunteer organization go-
ing. 

Equipment needed in-
cludes such items as feed 
sacks, chains, shovels and 
axes. Volunteers who may 
not be physically able to 
fight fires but who can drive 
are also welcome to par-
ticipate. Of course those 
physically able are 
welcome. 

Citizens throughout the 
area can help by taking 
precautions against fire, by 
staying out of the way of 
firefighters and by offering 
cold drinks and coffee to 
those who are volunteering 
to fight fires in this area. 

and rescue and ex-
tinguishing pit, transport 
tanker, butane, liquified 
petroleum gas, natural gas, 
Christmas tree, car and 
house fires. They were told 
how to deal with accidents 
involving 	hazardous 
materials being transported 
and learned to operate and 
work with beathing ap-
paratus. 

Both firefighters inter-
viewed felt that the school 
was well worth the time they 
volunteered. They agreed 
they learned much that 
could be shared at the mon-
thly training sessions here. 

The local department 
thanks Gorman and Cross 
Plains fire departments for 
the loan of the bunker gear; 
it was an invaluable aid in 
the training segments of the 
school. 

The Rising Star Rural Fire 

The six members of the 
Rising Star Rural Fire 
Department sent to Abilene 
Area Fire Prevention School 
last week plan to share what 
they learned with other 
members of the department 
at upcoming training ses-
sions. 

Those attending the train-
ing school, sponsored by 
Abilene Fire Department, 
State Firemen & Fire 
Marhals Association of 

Texas and Midwest Texas 
Firemen & Fire Marshals 
Association, were Ted Mur-
phree, Willie Vandivere, 
Donnett Nall, Bruce Rivers, 
David Curtis and Billy Nall. 

The local firefighters at-
tended three-hour courses 

for four nights last week. 
Studies and training inlcud-
ed hose handling, incident 
command, airplane crash 

Rising StarISD Board Meeting 
Booster Club News 

Bob Cox, vocational 
education teacher at Pott-
sboro High School, has been 
named speaker for the 1989 
Homecoming Assembly 
which is scheduled to con-
vene in the Rising Star High 
School gymnasium on Satur-
day, Sept. 16, at 9. 

Cox will speak from a 
varied background of ex-
periences. He is a 1949 

graduate of Rising Star High--
School where he actively 
participated in football, ten-
nis, drama and journalism. 
He holds degrees from both 
Baylor University and 
Golden Gate Seminary and 
had additional training at 
West Texas State Universi-
ty. He has served as pastor 
of Baptist churches in 

California, taught at both 
college and high school 
levels and at various times 
been a salesman, referee, 
coach, lumberjack, actor, 
model and public speaker. 

Cox's acting career in-
cludes character parts on 
"Dallas" and other televi-
sion shows, plus a number of 
television commercials. For 
the past five years he and his 
wife, Betty, have been active 

The Rising Star Booster 
Club kicked off its 1989-90 
season Tuesday, Aug. 22, at 
the high school football field 
with an ice cream supper for 
parents, players, coaches, 
and cheerleaders. Introduc-
tions were made of the '89 
football team along with the 
managers and the new 
coach, Darwin Browning, 
and cheerleaders. 

Officers were elected for 
the year, and tney are: 
Presiden, Cindy Elliott; 
Vice-President, Danny 
Hughes; Secretary, Billy 
Harmon; Treasurer, Stella 
Ware; and Reporter, Brenda 
Ezzell. 

in a motion by Long, second-
ed by Harris. 

Stuteville, high school 
principal, gave a report con-
cerning the possible increase 
in enrollment and availabili-
ty of classroom space. 

Hill, principal, gave a 
report concerning construc-
tion improvements and com-
pluter capabilities on the 
elementary campus. 

Allen, Athletic Director, 
gave a report concerning the 
start of footbaall practice 
and the number 'of athletes 
and reported the fall billing 
for athletic expenditures. 

Members of the board 
thanked the administration 
for an excellent job of con-
trolling expenditures for the 
past school year. They also 
commended both principals 
for excellence in their roles 
as teachers and ad-
ministratiors during the last 
school year. 

The meeting adjourned at 
9:42 p.m. 

past school year to reflect 
actual expenditures. 

A motion by G. Wilson, 
seconded by Green, to make 
an addition to the Board 
Policy EIA (Local) carried. 
The addition: 

"RSISD District-wide 
Reteach Policy: The grade 
book will be the source used 
for identifying students that 
have not mastered the essen-
tial elements. Daily work 
and test grades will be used. 
Reteach will not be required 
more than twice but must be 
documented in lesson plan 
book and in grade book. 
Leave the failing grade in 
the grade book and a / 
through it and show the new 
grade when retaught. This 
new grade cannot be more 
than a 70." 

The management plan ad-
dressing the corrective ac-
tions cited by the TEA Ac-
creditation Monitoring 
TEam as submitted by the 
administration was accepted 

in theater groups in which 
Bob's credits include a 
number of major character 
roles. He often models for 
advertisements, posters, 
etc. as Santa Claus and once 
appeared as a traffic cop on 
a 	Dallas 	Cowboy 
Cheerleader calendar. 

Highly acclaimed for his 
speaking ability, Cox's ex-
perience has been mostly at 
civic affairs, banquets and 
Chtirch functions. One 
listener hailed him as 
"definitely 	having 
something going for him as a 
public speaker. Bob's wit, in-
tellect, voice tone and self 
confidence make for a very 
interesting and delightful 
( time) of entertainment." 

Bob Cox was born and 
reared in Rising Star. He 
was the youngest child and 
the only son of Claude and 
May (Jones) Cox, descen-
dants of original settlers of 
the community. He has two 
sisters: Florine Forbes, 1940 
RSHS graduate and 1988 
homecoming speaker, and 
Sara Alice Roebuck, 1995 
RSHS graduate. Bob and his 
wife, Betty, have three sons, 
two daughters-in-law, and 
three grandchildren. 

Watch for the Booster Club 
booth at the Homecoming. 

The Rising Star Booster 
Club met Monday, Sept. 4, at 
7 p.m. at the high school 
library. A general business 
meeting was conducted at 
which time it was decided to 
have a membership drive. 
Individual memberships are 
$5.00, and an "I Love Rising 
Star" sticker will be given. A 
couple's membership will be 
$7.50, and a Rising Star 
Wildcat cap will be given. 
Anyone interested in becom-
ing a member should contact 
an officer or Coach Nathan 
Allen. 

The Booster Club will have 
a membership drive booth 
set up during the homecom-
ing activities, along with 
various Wildcat products for 
sale. 

New individual team 
member posters will soon be 
in yards about town. Watch 
for them, and show your sup-
port. 

Following viewing of the 
Rising Star-Baird scrim-
mage film of the previous 
Friday, the meeting was ad-
journed. 

The Wildcats take on Santo 
this Friday at 8 p.m. in San-
to. Local Early Childhood 

Program Begins Monday 

Class Reunions Set 
have his/her child evaluated 
for this program should con-
tact Weldon Hill or Pat Lee 
at 643-2431 or, after 5 p.m., 
Betty Meiron at 643-1662 or 
take the child to the elemen-
tary school at 10:30 a.m. 
Monday. 

The Rising Star Booster 
Club met Monday, Aug, 28, 
at 7:00 p.m., at the high 
school library. The meeting 
was called to order by Presi-
dent Cindy Elliott. Coach 
Nathan Allen introduced the 
captains for the football 
team this year: Seniors, 
Derrick White, Toby Long, 
and Lee DeLong, and 
Juniors, Brian Bailey and 
Donny Alcorn. Projects for 
the coming year were 
discussed. Plans for the up-
coming homecoming ac-
tivities were reviewed. The 
Friday night scrimmage 
with Roby where Rising Star 
scored fourteen points over 
Roby's seven points was 
reviewed, and the meeting 
was adjourned. 

The next Booster Club 
meeting will be Monday, 
Sept. 4, 7:00 p.m. at the high 
school library. Anyone in-
terested in becoming a 
booster club member is in-
vited to attend. 

by Roanen Barron 
The Wildcats went head to 

head against the number 
four team in the state, the 
Baird Bears, in a scrimmage 
at Baird Sept. 1. In my opi-
nion the Wildcats played a 
remarkable game consider-
ing that this was the second 
scrimmage prior to the open-
ing of regular season play. 

The final score was 4 to 1 
but it should have been 0 to O. 
The scoring came for Baird 
from a few long passes and a 
Wildcat fumble. An intercep-
tion by the Wildcats produc-
ed their only touchdown. 

The Wildcat defense did 
very well, shutting down 
Baird's ground game. The 
second team did exceptional-
ly well. Baird's offense could 
hardly keep things going. 
They had to resort to long 
passes and, even then, their 
quarterback was pressured 
to throw soon or suffer being 
sacked. 

The Wildcat offense had 
some trouble against a good 
Bear defense. Junior 
quarterback Jimmy Evans 
surmised, "We did fair but 
we didn't execute like we 
should have." The offense 
gained over 100 yards total. 

Senior Cody Wilson summ-
ed up the scrimmage by say-
ing, "We did a good job con-
sidering the team we played. 
We had too many mistakes 
and we have some things to 
work on, but overall we 
played fairly well." 

Assistant Coach Doyle 
Browning thought the 'Cats 
improved from last week but 
they still have a ways to go. 

After the scrimmage head 
coach Nathan Allen told the 
team, "This game doesn't 
count, but it matters that we 
got after them." 

Rising Star Independent 
School District will be star-
ting the Early Childhood pro-
gram for handicapped and 
developmentally delayed 
children ages three to five 
years on Monday, Sept. 11. 

Any parent wishing to 

Class of 1934 will have a 
get together Sept. 15 at 7 
p.m. at Cook's Fish Barn, 
located approximately 
halfway between Rising Star 
and Comanche on Highway 
36, on left side of highway go-
ing toward Comanche. 

Y'all come and let's have 
FUN!!! 

Class of '69 is making 

Address 
Help Needed 

Members of the Class of 
1959 are planning a reunion 
and need addresses of these 
classmates: Sharon Stovall 
Johnson, Billy Rhine, Larry 
McCollum, Kenneth Reed, 
Kenneth Ridens and 
Franklin Harrell. If anyone 
can help in locating these 
people, please call (817) 
643-1422 or 643-6110. City Sets Tax Rate 

The Rising Star Indepen-
dent School District board 
members and personnel met 
Aug. 14 at 8 p.m. at the board 
room. 

Present were President 
Larry Wilson, Vice-
President Tony Long, 
Secretary David Harris, 
Ronnie Green, Gary Wilson, 
and Larry Chambers. Dr. 
Charles Barnes was absent. 

School personnel present 
were Dr. Donald E. Bryan, 
Weldon Hill, Robby 
Stuteville, Nathan Allen and 
Kathy Herring. Also present 
was Betty Meiron. 

Minutes of the July 6 
meeting were read and ap-
proved, as were the minutes 
of the special meeting 
(budget workshop) on July 
24. 

Supt. Bryan reported that 
the district was in receipt of 
an official notification from 
the State Board of Insurance 
stating that the district has 
corrected all fire safety pro-
jects and that they were clos-
ing their files on the Rising 
Star ISD facility. 

Roanen Barron addressed 
the board as the Rising Star 
High School Student Council 
President. 

A statement of cash in 
bank was given by Bryan. 

The resignation of Eve 
Landers, effective July 20, 
was accepted. 

Board members voted to 
give reasonable assurance of 
employment to Shelly Bailey 
as bus driver. 

The low milk bid from 
Borden Milk for the school 
year was accepted. 

A resolution was made to 
amend the budget for the 

plans to meet; details are 
not complete. 

Class of '79 will meet at the 
former home of the late 
Ruby Ballew after the pep 
rally. Family members, in-
cluding children, are 
welcome. 
Class of '84 will meet at the 
home of Steve and Shelly Hill 
after the pep rally, about 4. 

Golf Scramble Winners 
BRAG CORNER 

2nd MONDAY 
SCHOOL BOARD 

BRAG CORNER 2nd TUESDAY 
CITY COUNCIL 
CHAMBER OF COM-
MERCE Thanks to the members of 

Lakewood Recreation 
Center for bringing the cake 
and ice cream to make such 
an enjoyable ending for the 
Labor Day golf scramble. 
We had a good turnout and a 
good, good time. 

Winning teams of the golf 
scramble were: first place, 

1st THURSDAY 
RURAL FIRE 

Rising Star Rural Fire 
Department Board of Direc-
tors meets first Thursdays, 
5:15 p.m., Twin Drilling Co. 

Firefighters meet and hold 
a training session im-
mediately following the 
directors' meeting. 

seconded by Crisp, that a 
.61769 tax rate be adopted 
carried unanimously. 

A discussion on juvenile 
delinquency was tabled until 
further investigation. 

The discussion on the Ivie 
property was also tabled un-
til a later date. 

The meeting adjourned at 
8:52 p.m. 

Next council meeting was 
set for Sept. 12 at 7 n.m. 

Rising Star City Council 
met Tues., Aug. 8, at City 
Hall at 7 p.m. Councilmen 
present were James Cook, 
Clinton Crisp, Moose Vaughn 
and Cole White. Absent was 
John G. Lee. 

Minutes of the July 11 
regular meeting were ac-
cepted as read, as was the 
treasurer's report. 

Following the tax rate 
discussion a motion by Cook, 

Bili Porter, Donald Wester-
man, John Taylor. Virginia 
Green and Jean Fore: se-
cond place, Oliver Smith, 
Ken Horan, John Hoelter 
and Juakana Scott; and 
third place, John Ely, Gary 
Westerman, Virgil Clark, 
Lou Grider and Betty 
Westerman. 

Elm Cemetery Donations 

2nd WEDNESDAY 
License tags, J.P. Office 

License tag renewals may 
be obtained the second 
Wednesday of each month at 
the office of the Justice of the 
Peace, S. Main St. 

BLOOD PRESSURE 
TAKEN 

Blood pressures will be 
taken at Rising Star Senior 
Citizens Center Thurs., Sept. 
7, between 10:30 and 11:30 

MAY HOMECOMING 
Homecoming for May 

Schools will be Saturday, Oc-
tober 21. Ambulance Fund 

Receives Donations 

and Lula Claborn Estate. 
Jack Fincher, Adele Whit-
ten, Ella Burns, Irene Good-
win, Douglas Burns, Wanda 
Hardy and Bobby Wheeler. 
The total amount was 
$495.82. 

Those making donations to 
Elm Cemetery Association 
for 1989 are as follows: 
Willard Rogers, Bonnice 
Cox, Marguerite Alford, 
Clinton Crisp, the late J.W. 

RSNC BIRTHDAY PARTY 
The monthly birthday par-

ty for residents of Rising 
Star Nursing Center will be 
Thurs., Sept. 7, at 2:30 p.m. 

EACH THURSDAY 
SENIOR CITIZENS 

EACH SATURDAY 
BINGO, American Legion 
Hall 

Pentecostal Church 
Fellowship! Meting 

CHELSEA DENISE 
4 months 

Parents: Ted & Sherri Mur-
phree 
Grandparents: Mr. & Mrs. 
W.E. Murphree, Rising 
Star; Mr. & Mrs. C.M. 
Shoemaker, Brownwood 

RANCE HEATH 
6 months 

Parents: Dena & Jerry 

Knight, Brownwood 
Grandparents: VonDene & 
Kenneth Willett, Rising 
Star 
Great-gandmothers: 
Goldene Ware, Rising Star; 
Sadie Ervin, May 

SCHOOL CALENDAR 
by Cathy Smoot 

THUR., SEP. 7 
Senior, football and school 
pictures will be taken. 

FRI., SEP. 8 
Pep rally, 3:10. 
Football game 8 p.m. in San-
to 

TUE., SEP. 12 
PTO, school gym, 7 p.m. 

SAT., SEP. 16 
Homecoming activities. 
Football game, vs. Santa An-
na, 8 p.m. 

The "Drawing Nigh to 
God" fellowship meeting 
will be at the Pentecostal 
Church in Pioneer Friday, 

Donations to Rising Star 
Emergency Medical Ser-
vice, our ambulance, made 
since last reported are listed 
below: 

Nettie Wilson, May First 
Baptist Church Sunday 
School Class, Ivy Allen, Ber-
tha Mae White, Elizabeth 
Robertson, Mrs. A.C. Smith, 
Jeanie Gracey Clark (given 

to Saturday Cluo for am-
bulance ), Harold Pierson, 
Patsy C. Huber, Mr. and 
Mrs. E.G. Henry, Mrs. 
James J. Smith, May First 
Baptist Church WMU, Sybil 
Parker, C.M. Jessup, A.J. 
Butler and Polly Barnes 
Parker. 

If any name has been omit-
led, please call (817)  
643-4572. 

BOOSTER CLUB 
The Booster Club meets 

each Monday at 7 p.m. in the 
high school library. 
Everyone is welcome. 

Sept. 8, beginning at 7:30. 
p.m. 

Come and enjoy the good 
fellowship of God's people. 

Ruby McCowen 



proarean 
16.5 ACRES on. '. Mill Street, 
lots road 4 -15) most in 
coastal, 431-"00 with low 
down payi..ent. 
300 ACRES Sipe Springs area, 
partially timbered, good deer, 
turkey, sandy loam soil, good 
fences, $400 per acre. 
1400 ACRES, 2 sets of im-
provements, 5 acre lake, 11/2  
mi. of Sabanno creek, good 
deer & turkey, $500 per acre. 
81 ACRES near Carbon, about 
20 cultivated. 1 well, tank, 
big oak trees & road on 3 
sides. $575 ac. 
161 ACRES Lots bottom land, 
pecans, 60 tillable, well fenc-
ed, 1/2  mile Sabanna, good 
deer hunting, lots big oak, 
pecans. $550 ac. Agent own-
ed. 
58 ACRES, Several big trees, 2 
tanks, some coastal, most 
new fences, lots road front. 
$550 ac. E-ZZ terms. 
246 ACRES Carbon area. 62 
ac. grain land, native grasses, 
6 tanks, good to new fences, 
road on 31/2  sided, runs 25-30 
cows. $450 at. 

We WANT Your Listings 
34 Yrs. in Business 

COGII1JRN REALTY 
893-6666 	893-5898 
893-2642 	DE LEON 

I

ACTION REALTY 
WE NEED LISTINGS!!! 

Equal Housing Opportunity 

915-643-6516 

Bring your TV, radio, 
stereo, small appliances 
to DAD'S DOO-DADS & 
REPAIR SHOP at 300 S. 
Graves, off W.Hy. 36, 
Rising Star. New & used 
merchandise. Shop work 
only. 817 643.5909 

Need 	things 	fixed 	up 
around 	the 	house? 	Or 
wooden 	furniture 	made 
or 	repaired? 	Call 	Joe 
Campbell, 	CAMPBELL'S 
CABINET 	SHOP, 	(817) 
842-5875 	Rt. 	5 	Box 
1078, 	Comanche, 	TX 
76442 If no answer call 
(817) 643-2251. 

WILLIE VANDIVERE 
TRUCKING 

Dirt, Caliche Hauling 
Build Lease Roads, 

Driveways, etc. 
9 -5 	Call 643-2023 

After S Call 643-6451 

D & R UPHOLSTERY 

643-3942 	Rising Star 
For 	your 	upholstery 
needs. 
Country, Continental & 
Baloon style curtains. 

Debbie Jones, owner 

FAST DEPENDABLE 
Film Developing 

PALACE DRUG STORE 
643-3231 	Rising Star 

BUDDY COOK 
Residential, Commercial 
Refrigeration & Plumbing 

817-643-7312 
Rising Star 

JOHN DEERE 
NEW 

PEANUT 
LILLISTON 

TRACTORS 
AND USED 
EQUIPMENT 

• KMC 
PLANTERS-DISKS-
DRILLS - ROLLING 

JOHN DEERE 

CULTIVATORS- 
CHISELS 

SELL OR TRADE 
84 ST TN Y. INC 11 ARK TRACTOR 

DELEON 	(17) 893-2061 
COMAI•ICHE 	(915)356-3922 

WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED 

R552 

Rising Star 

ROCK 3 BR, 1 - 11 on highway, 
fenced garden area. Call to-
day! 
STUCCO 3 BR, 2 B, dining 
room, carpet, laundry room 
with sink, water well. Priced 
to sell! 
CLOSE TO PARK, 2 BR, 1 B, 
hardwood floors, breakfast 
nook, large lot. Call Stella! 
2 BR, 1 B, SUN room. Needs 
some work. Acreage. Call to-
day 
2 BR, 1 B, LARGE rooms, 
recently done over. Close to 
school on paved road. Call to-
day. 
2 BR, 1 13, DINING room, 
water well, close to town. Call 
today. 
3 BR, 2 B, ROCK on B'wood 
hwy. Needs lots of work. Pric-
ed cheap. 
BE THE BOSS! Working grocery 
sloe, meat market, vegetable 
bins, inventory. Call Stella for 
details! 
2 LOTS AT Shamrock Shores, 
Lake Brownwood. Call! 

James Smith broker 646-0297 

IN RISING STAR 
STELLA WARE 	643-3591 

HOUSE FOR SALE on West Col-
lege Street. Corner lot, good 
water well. Priced for quick 
sale. Call 817-643-2854. 

16-26 

SELLING YOUR HOMEOR BUY-
ING? Call Stella Ware, 
643-3591, your local real 
estate agent for Action Real-

' ty, Brownwood, James Smith, 
broker. 	 26.52 

OLIVER WEST, PUMP 
SALES & SERVICE 

817-643-4683 

Rising Star, Texas 

Complete systems sold & 

serviced 

21/2  miles south of town 

[

JIM 	RATLIFF 
WELDING 
Oilfield and Farm 

817-643.6464 
Rising Star 

CARPET CLEANING Residen-
tial, Commercial, Free 
Estimates, Scotchguarding 
available. New Carpet & Vinyl 
sold and installed. Dub 
Meador 725.7720 	3S-52 

BROWNWOOD 

MUFFLER Ise 
Yi144/0,01 (.11W7/4 SHOP 

OUP IVC-4..,;te.C.06 /A'P A14 

(915)646-0716 
200 N. Main 

Vi 	 Brownwood. Tx 76801 James P. Smith 
Owner 

Distributor for 
Fairbanks-Morse Pumps. 

Complete systems, sales & service. 

PVC 1/2" - 6 " pipe. 
Water well casing 4" - 8". 
Irrigation sales & service. 

Buddy's Plumbing 
& Appliance  

112 N. Main 	 Rising Star 

. 	817-643-7312 CESO 
0.539 

Home Phone 643-5742 	Gasoline & Diesel 

CAREY'S AUTOMOTIVE 
Open Mon. - Fri. 7:30 a.m -5:30 p.m. 

Sat. 8 a.m.-12 Noon 

James Carey, Mechanic 
Hwy. 36 East 	 Rising Star 
Shop Phone 643-7009 
	

RS1552 

REBUILD 
ENGINES 

OWNER 

JAKE LANDESS 

Aluminum 
Welding 

JAKE'S SHOP 
GENERAL MECHANICAL 

WELDING FABRICATION 

Body Work & Painting 

817643-3031 

AUTO 
TRANSMISSION 

404 N MAIN 
RISING STAR, TX 

rs52 

Susan J. Schaefer 
Certified Public Accountant 

9th & Main 	P.O. Box 501 
Cross Plains, Tx 76443 

Office: 817-725-6747 
Home: 817-442-3784 

Main Street 
Auto Repair 

Open Monday - Friday 	8 - 5 p.m. 
CUSTOM MUFFLER 
& TAILPIPE WORK 

Jackie Palmore - Mechanic 
643-1701 

Hwy. 183 	 Rising Star, Texas 

MAJOR OIL PRODUCTS 
Station & Farm Tank 
Hoses, Nozzles, Filters 

AT REASONABLE PRICES 
Farm Fuel Delivered 

CROSS PLAINS PETROLEUM 
(E.S.E. Inc.) 

P.O. Box 219, 6th at Ave. F 

David and Lenell Sliger 	Cross Plains 
Managers 	 R43 	(817) 725-6582 

RADIO EQUIPPED TRUCKS 
FOR "FAST FRIENDLY SERVICE" 

1-800-535-7562 
WELLS PROPANE 

Hwy 377E Box 425 
Comanche, TX 76442 

915-356-2516 

Rt. 1. Box 82A 
May TX 76857 
817-259-3204 

DISCOUNT FOR CASH 

Thursday, September 7, 1989 

Obituaries 

CLASSIFIEDS 
Senior Center 

News 
Ice cream, cake, cookies 

and finger sandwiches were 
served at the lovely birthday 
party honoring Norman and 
Lolene Claborn, Inez Elliott 
and Carrie Gaines Aug. 29. 
Walter Richburg and Lenell 
Henry were unable to attend. 
We made an error last week, 
listing September birthdays 
rather than the August ones 
we honored. 

Hostesses for August were 
Martha Carouth, Stella Hill 
and Irma Jones. A special 
thanks to Martha for clean-
ing the building. We ap-
preciate all those who help 
with our birthday party each 
month. 

Glenn Shults got a good 
report at the veterans 
hospital in Temple. 

Bill Gray and Lucille 
Cooper went to Eastland. 

Opal Whiteside and Ellie 
Elliott visited the club 
Thursday. 
- The ladies of the club are 
all busy gettilng those 
vegetables and fruits put up 
for winter days ahead. 

Stella Hill brought a 
delicious fig cake for lunch. 
She had a time keeping it un-
til lunch - everyone wantd a 
sample with morning coffee. 

Martha wishes to thank 
everyone who helped with 
the club party last Tuesday 
night. She has been taking 
shots each day. 

Ed Miller and H.L. Gray 
visited our club Thursday. 

The center was closed 
Monday for Labor Day. We 
hope everyone enjoyed the 
holiday weekend. 

Marjorie West enjoyed her 
birthday Saturday. She and 
Marion went fishing for the 
day, catching a nice mess of 
fish. A granddaughter, Amy 
West, made Marjorie a bir-
thday cake and Marjorie ap-
preciated the remembrance 
very much. 

Those at our center who 
have been sick are improv-
ing nicely. We miss each of 
you when you are away. 

We are sorry to hear Bill 
Gardner broke his hip from a 
fall. 

Have a good week. 
Marjorie West 

Katie Harrell 
Happy 

Birthday Zola Mae Henderson 

R. S. Nursing Center 
Vickie Majors Activity Director 

MON.: We had in-room ac-
tivities, distributed mail and 
played bingo. Players were 
Jennye Turner 1, Vera 
Forbes 1, Rose Nichols 3, 
Pauline Hill 3. Joe Fox 3, 
Martha Irby 4, Vera Hill 1, 
Pearl Petty 3 and Buster 
Rixford 1. 

TUES.: We had in-room 
activities, distributed mail 
and Ruby McCowen and a 
friend were here to sing for 
us. 

WED.: The ladies were 
busy crocheting in their 
rooms, mail was distributed 
and we played bingo. 
Players were Joe Fox 4, 
Pauline Hill 5, Pearl Petty 5, 
Vera Forbes 2, Rose Nichols 
I, Jennye Turner 4, Essie 
Green 6, Maggie Christian 1, 
Vera Hill 1, Martha Irby 5 
and Buster Rixford 4. 

THURS.: A few of the 
residents sat on the patio and 
watched the humming birds 
drink from their feeders; 
distributed mail. 

FRI.: Distributed mail; 
several watched TV in the 
lobby and others played 
bingo. Players were Pauline 
Hill 4, Joe Fox 3, Vera 
Forbes 3, Pearl Petty 1, Jen-
nye Turner 1, Essie Green 2, 
Vera Hill 4, Maggie Chris-
tian and Martha Irby 5 and 
Buster Rixford. 

Harvey and Geneva 
Kornegay and children 
visited Ellen Mayes. 

Buddy, Debbie Leigh and 
Lenn Belew were visitors of 
Pearl Petty. 

Barry Nichols and a friend 
visited his grandmother, 
Rose Nichols. 

Linda Cox from Bastrop 
visited Maggie Christian. 

Thanks to the First Baptist 
Church for Sunday services. 

Our monthly birthday par-
ty will be Thurs., Sept. 7, at 
2. 

Residents having bir-
thdays this month are 
Pauline Hill 9-1-1906; Della 
Roberts 9-3-1900; Vera Hill 
9-16-1901; Martha Irby 
9-3-1898; Pearl Nunnally 
9-21-1901; and Eunice Nor-
wood 9-26-1908. 

Rising Sta:.  
sells 

RIMER STAMPS  

THANK YOU 

MAY - Katie Kathleen 
Harrell, 64, died Sunday at a 
Brownwood hospital. 

Graveside services were 
held at 11 a.m. Tuesday in 
the May Cemetery with the 
Rev. Darrell Dossey of-
ficiating, directed by Higgin-
botham Funeral Home of 
Rising Star. 

Born in Woodson, she was 
a homemaker and a 
Methodist. 

Survivors include a 
daughter, Beverly Pittman 
of May; three sons, Don 
Southern of Coleman and 
Gary Harrell and Jimmy 
Harrell, both of May; a 
brother, Kenneth Smith of 
May; three sisters, Bea Hor-
ton of Lake Buchanan; 
Gladys Lancaster and Rita 
Smith, both of Bangs; and 
seven grandchildren. 

REAL ESTATE 

COMANCHE - Services for 
Zola Mae Henderson, 69, 
were held at 3 p.m. Sunday 
at the Hall & Chaney 
Funeral Home Chapel with 
the Rev. Gary Watson of-
ficiating. Burial was in the 
Comanche Gardens of 
Memory Cemetery. 

She died Friday at her 
home. 

Born in Melvin, she was a 
homemaker and a member 
of the Victory Baptist 
Church. 

Survivors include her hus-
band, Joe Henderson of 
Comanche; three sons, Ed-
ward Bates of Brighton, 
Colo., and James W. Bates 
and Eugene Bates, both of 
Comanche; a daughter, Rita 
McClain of Dilley; her 
mother, Anna Bell Brown of 
Comanche; a brother, 
Charlie Fortune of Loui-
siana; four sisters, Jewel 
Coker of Rising Star, Bonnie 
White of Round Rock, Lola 
Stewart of Fort Worth and 
Vila Bell Kendall of Illinois; 
and six grandchildren. 

SEPTEMBER 1 
Mrs. J.H. Casey 
Terry Webb 
Tricia Jones Hutchinson 
Vickie Bibb 

SEPTEMBER 2 
C.W. Richter 
Earl Wright 

SEPTEMBER 3 
SEPTEMBER 4 

Mike Polk 
Johnny Hubbard 
Glen Winfrey 
Brooke Martin 
Jimmie Wilson 

SEPTEMBER 5 
Oleta Seale 
Micah Butler 

SEPTEMBER 6 
Dick Clarke 
David Harris 
Amy Dudley 

SEPTEMBER 7 
Lillian Howard 
Tommy Pernell 

SEPTEMBER 8 
Ione White 
Harold Butler 
Polly Price 

SEPTEMBER 9 
Mike Rhodes 
John Lee 
Mearlin Jones 
Arley Bibby 
Travis Butler 

SEPTEMBER 10 
Ray Nunnally 
E.D. LeBleu 

SEPTEMBER 11 
Frank Gray 
Stephanie Long 

SEPTEMBER 12 
Carter Jones 
Mrs. Jim Pittman 

SEPTEMBER 13 
Eva Clark 

SEPTEMBER 14 
Janet Murphy 
Cindy Elliott 
Regina Rust 
Billy Nall 

FOR SALE 

FOR SALE Golf carts & golf 
cart trailers. To see, come to 
3rd house on 1-20 west of 
Union Hill Rd. between Baird & 
Clyde, or call 915-893-2662  

FREE TICKET to WEST TEXAS 
FAIR & Rodeo with purchase of 
any Wrangler jean. Limit I per 
person while supply lasts. 
Johnson's Dry Goods, Cross 
Plains 	 36 

PIANO FOR SALE Wonted 
responsible party to assume 
small monthly payments on 
piano. See locally. Call credit 
manager at 1.800 233-8663. 

35-37 

USED CARPET, commercial 
grade, short nap. Carpet, 
pad, installation & cleaning, 
$5.50 sq. yd. Dub Meador 
725.7720 	 39-52 

WANTED 

WANTED, RESPONSIBLE PARTY 
to take up payments on TROY- 
BILT tiller, used twice. 
643.3028 	 36.37 

CHILD CARE, All ages; after 
school core too; 5:30 a.m. tit 
6:30 p.m. Coll 643-5505 

33-36 

We want to thank everyone 
for their kindnesses and words 
of sympathy and for the food 
and flowers received during 
the lengthy illness and at the 
death of our loved one, Ruby 
Doris McBride. 

We especially thank the 
Rev. Don Longoria. 

Linda, Jack, 
Jackie & Chris Wilson 

Louise Bailey 

Thank you so much for your 
visits, phone calls, cards, the 
beautiful gown and for your 
love and concern since I have 
been ill.. 

I love you all. 
Cloia Tucker 

Nolan Junior Hutton 

Nolan Junior Hutton, 72, 
died Tuesday at a 
Brownwood hospital. 

Graveside services were 
held at 11 a.m. Thursday in 
the Blake Cemetery in 
Brown County with the Rev. 
Darrell Dossey officiating, 
directed by Higginbotham 
Funeral Home. 

Born in Rockwood, he 
moved from Brown County 
to Rising Star. 

He was a tool clerk for 
General Dynamics in Fort 
Worth, retiring in 1973, and 
was a Baptist. 

Survivors include his wife, 
Dow Hutton of Rising Star, 
his stepmother, Mary Hutton 
of Lockney; a daughter; 
Mary Barnes of Early; a 
son, George Hutton of Azle; - 
a brother, Thomas Hutton of 
Oklahoma City; 10 grand-
children; and two great-
grandchildren. 

SERVICES 

Willie Mae Bearden 
COLORADO CITY - Willie 

Mae Bearden, 68, died Fri-
day at a Brownwood 
hospital. 

Services were held at 2 
p.m. Sunday at the Kiker-
Seale Funeral Home Chapel 
with the Rev. R.D. Williams 
officiating. Burial was in 
Colorado City Cemetery. 

Born in Mitchell County, 
she moved to Rising Star 12 
years ago from Colorado Ci- 
ty. 

She was a homemaker and 
the widow of Elmer 
Bearden. 

Survivors include two 
daughters, Lisa Bearden of 
Houston and Laura Bearden 
of Big Spring; three sons, 
Melvin Lunceford of 
Brownwood and Lloyd 
Lunceford and Charlie 
Lunceford, both of Rising 
Star; a sister, Frances 
Goode of Colorado City; 19 
grandchildren; and eight 
great-grandchildren. 

HELP WANTED 

NEED LVN relief some 6-2, 
some 2.10 shift or either shift 
if both not preferred. Salary 
dependent on experience. Call 
Russell Gray, Rising Star Nurs-
ing Center. 643-2691 19-39 Isa Lee Henry PERSONAL 
NEEDED: NURSES AIDES 6-2 & 
2-10. No experience 
necessary, we'll train. Star-
ting salary commensurate 
with experience & ability. 
Contact Russell Gray at Rising 
Star Nursing Center, 
643-2691 36-5r 

FORSAN - Isa Lee (Mrs. 
Ted) Henry, 74, died August 
30 at an Abilene hospital. 

Services were held at 4 
p.m. Thursday at the Nalley-
Pickle & Welch Rosewood 
Chapel with the Rev. David 
Robertson officiating. Burial 
was in the Trinity Memorial 
Park. 

Born in Stephenville, she 
moved to Forsan in 1945. 

She was a member of the 
First Methodist Church and 
the widow of T.T. "Ted" 

.Henry. 
Survivors include two 

sons, Tom W. Henry of Big 
Spring and Dan Henry of 
Paducah; a brother, Bill 
Ftampley of Glendale, Ariz.; 
and three grandsons. 

Weekend visitors in the 
home of Virgil and Eva 
Clark included their son, Joe 
Clark of Houston, the H.D. 
Clarks of Kermit and the 
Bob Smiths of Gouldbusk. 

Carlton Clark of Eastland 
visited with Virgil and Eva 
and took part in the golf 
scramble at Lakewood. 

RESPONSIBLE PERSON WANTED 
to own and operate high profit 
candy vending route. Na-
tionally proven program since 
1959 - includes training. Re-
quires cash investment of 
$4237 to $14070. Call 
1-800-328-0723 EAGLE IN- 
DUSTRIES Since 1959 	36 

SERVICES 

Rising Star's Local Agent For: 

Abilene 
Reporter-News 

Is Sandra Barnard 
Box 92 

Rising Star, Tx. 76471 

NEED SOMEONE to stay with 
me from 10-1. 643-3622 

36-37 

THE RISING STAR 
BOX 127 817-643-4141 

Rising Star, Texas 76471 
104 N. Main 

©1989 Eastland County News-
paper, Inc. Publication No. CUSPS 
466500) 

Second Class Postage paid at 
Rising Star, Texas, under Act of 
Congress in March, 1870. Published 
every Thursday. Publishers, Mr. and 
Mrs. H.V. O'Brien. 

Subscription Rates Per Year: 
Eastland County and 30 mi. radius 
of Rising Star, S9; other Texas coun-
ties S13; out of Texas,S19; No out of 
U.S. without APO. 

POSTMASTER: Send address 
changes to The Rising Star, BOX 

127, Rising Star, TX 76471. 

FOR RENT 

Public Housing Authority 
has apartments for rent 
for senior citizens. Equal 
housing opportunity. 
817.643-3812 	or 
643-6791. RISING STAR 

For Subscription Rates, 

Call Sandra Barnard 643-1301 

Early Morning Delivery! LIVESTOCK 
FARM 

EQUIPMENT ANGUS BULLS for sale, 817 
647.1155 or 647-1182 r104 

ANGUS BULLS for sale. James 
Ratliff. Call 647-1260 or 
647-1667. 

RS42 

FOR SALE: Massey Ferguson 
- propane tractor, approx. 30 

h.p., 3 point hookup. Ex-
cellent running condition. 308 
West 8th, Cisco. 442.1488 or 

- 442.4477 $1800. 

Hale Trailer Dealer 
2 Horse Trailers 

Gooseneck Horse & Stock 
Trailers, Covered & Open 

Bumper Pull Stock Trailers, 
Covered & Open Top 
Barker's Garage 

817-259-2252 May, Texas 

???? ARE YOU PAYING TOO MUCH ???? 
Compare These Everyday Low Prices On 

Genuine JOHN DEERE Ag. & Auto Filters 

JOHN DEERE AGRICULTURALTILTERS  
3020-4020 JD Engine Oil Filter (AR26350) 	S2.62 
30 Deries JD Engine Oil Filter (AR43634) 	S7.45 
40-50 Series JD Eng. Oil Finer (AR101278) 	510.18 
30-40 Series Fuel Filter (AR50041) 	 S7.42 
20-30 SeriesHydraulic Filter (AR75603) 	 $4.01 
40-50 Series Hydraulic Filter (AR94510) 	520.05 
4230-4240 Outer Air Filter (AR79941) 	 S19.91 
4430 	 1110 Outer Air Filter (AR79679) 	 $27.21 

JOHN DEERE AUTOMOTIVE OIL & AIR FILTERS  
Most US Gas Car & P/U Engine Oil Filters 	52.78 
Ford Diesel P/U Engine Oil Filter 	 55.72 
All GM Diesel Engine Oil Filters 	 52.78 
Most US Gas Car & P/U Air Cleaner Filters 	53.75 
Ford Diesel P/U Air Cleaner Filter 	 56.99 
All GM Diesel Engine Air Cleaner Filters 	55.99 

CLARK TRACTOR CM 
& SUPPLY INC. 

DeLeon: 817-893-2062 

	

Comanche: 915-356-3922 
	

JOHN DEERE 



CANTALOUPES_ 
LEMONS. 

.39c BARTLETT PEARS 1.89c POTATOES.,... 	.49c 
61$1 CABBAGE_ 	.19c ZUCCHINI SQUASH .59c 

9 

MR. TURKEY 	 SHURFRESH PORK 	 ADVANCE BREADED 
VARIETY PAK ,,.... 	 $ 1.99 1 LB. ROLL 	 STEAK FINGERS 	 ii $1.59 

BUN SIZE FRANKS ,,....---j-)ij 	79c SAUSAGE 	$ 1 .2 9  CORN DOGS IOCT P. 	 $ 2 8 9 
MR. TURKEY 	 STATE FAIR 

ir,••  

/ r , , 	
NEW CROP RED DELICIOUS 3  da /0 

k,,,40 APPLES LB. 	IOC TOMATOES LB. 49ci 
LARGE RED RIPE 

rag 

V -0 

BIS-KITS OR ... 
CORN-KITS 	= 	 41/2  OZ. SIZES 	 c'D 	 .• 

hutch:I:pies. 
$ I 39 4. $ 99.?  

MORRISON 

3/$1 ;' 

TURKEY, HAM, BOLOGNA, OR ROAST BEEF 

4 

BAG COFFEE 
FOIGERS. 13 02. 

AUTO-0111P. FIVE 
OA PM-REGULAR 

( 	SHEDD'S 
- COUNTRY CROCK 

3 LB.  

ORANGE JUICE 
4 	MINUTE MAIO 

12 OZ. CAN 

MEDIUM EGGS 
SHURFRESH GRADE "A" 

DOZEN 

79c 
$1.79 
AI99c 
$3.99 
$1.49 

*WI' 

1 89  

5 TO B OZ. PKGS. 
RICE A RONI 
HAMBURGER 
DILL SLICES „„—
BEST MAID 
SALAD DRESSING 
KELLOGG'S 
FROSTED FLAKES 

RICE 
RONI 79c 

°.51.69 
51.19 

..S2.69 

NEO-SYNEDHRIBIL 
DOUBLE PACK 
DERMASAGE 22 OZ. 
DISHWASHING LIQUID 
FIELD TRIAL 
CHUNK DOG FOOD—
CYCLE 9 
	DOG FOOD 

$3.89 
99c 

$3.99 

5P1 

FRUIT DRINKS 
TROPICANA 

10 OZ.  

RICH & READY 

PILLSBURY 
BISCUITS 
KRAFT 2 LB. 
VELVETA CHEESE 
ORE IDA 4 EAR 
CORN ON THE COB 
4,  OSCAR MAYER LUNCHABLES 1  1-7 	 

BACK TO SCHOOL REFUND 
SJlN rttund mail when vou buy 2 of the) 

parlinpafirt, .nets ant saes ORS.), refund 
csv=hin,vol2J.21::::1,1 3 ',gulag iszt brands 

1.::r Powder or. 4,:t. or Win; LIZL,alior 
13tz 30 oz. or Luger 

T-\ 

C awei 

One, poop 1 rpm g u•1 11 111.• to .otte.o, 23 1.19 

TOILET TISSUE 
NORTHERN 

4 ROLL PACKAGE 

PEPSI or DR. PEPPER 
12 OZ. CANS, 6 PACK 

$ 1 69 

CORN CHIPS 
PRINGLES 

99c 

'''‘. 11•111..1.1.11.111.1111 111111 111% 

BPI DRINKS 
2 LITER, ASSORTED FLAVORS 

79c 

) JUMBO 
FRANKS 

MR. TURKEY 
1 LB. PKG. 

SLICED SLAB 
BACON 

LB. 

C 

EVERY MONDAY IS 
SENIOR CITIZENS DAY 
-5% DISCOUNT ON 

YOUR TOTAL PURCHASES 
EXCLUDING CIGARETTES 

STORE HOURS 
MONDAY - SATURDAY, 7 A.M. - 8 P.M. 

SUNDAY, 8 A.M. - 7 P.M. 

We Have 
Money Orders QUANTITY 

RIGHTS 
RESERVED 

SAVE THIS AD, SHOP ANY DAY YOU LIKE — 

Postage Stamps 	SPECIAL PRICES IN THIS AD EFFECTIVE 
SEPTEMBER 6 thru SEPTEMBER 12, 1989 

Phone 725-7131, Cross Plains, Texas 	*FREE COFFEE WHILE YOU SHOP 	 We Have Postage Stamps & Money Orders 

t•e 

WE ACCEPT 
FOOD STAMPS 
& WIC CARDS 

WEEK LONG SPECIALS 
III Utl ili 	.11,111 

Tropicana. 
Fruit 

Punch 



Hellen's Hobby Handcrafted Gifts, Etc. 
A Specialty At 

FINER THINGS 
602 Conrad Hilton 

Pre-View To Christmas 
Open House 

Sat. - Sept. 30 	Sun. Oct 1 
10 - 5:00 	 12:30 - 3:30 
Refreshments 	Door Prizes 

578 •-• 

Computer Workstations 
Use By The Hour 

Complete With Software & Printers: 
Word Processing, Desk-top Publishing, 

Graphics, Newsletters, Mailing List 
& Form Letters 

Student Discounts 
Call 817-442-3764 cum 

nevi 

Computer Patch 308 E. 20th 
Cisco, Texas 

P.J.'S FASHIONS 
708-A CONRAD HILTON, CISCO 

ALL SPRING & SUMMER 
MERCHANDISE 

50% OFF OR MORE 
S-73 

SIDIck Nagle, Y.P. 

OIL of MINK 
Skin Care 

September 	AT 
Special Finer Things 
25% 
OFF 	602 Conrad Hilton 

Cisco, Texas 76437 
(New Location) 	5.78 

When-the time comes... 
LET US LOVE & CARE FOR 

Your Loved Ones. 
Providing T.L.C. in I.C.F. 

EASTLAND MANOR NURSING CENTER 
1405 W. Commerce St. Eastland 817-629-2686 

Peggy Pryor, Administrator 
Call soon for complete details 

and information 

Grad. 

• 

ViMir WIN 
Ilth Annual 

•FUNDAY • • ••Festivitie . • • • 
•• ta •• • •••• •• 

E 

a 
en 

to 

WSept_ember 9 
4:3013.m. to 

8:00 p.m. 
$10 per person 

FUNDay is an old-
fashioned political picnic 
with all the fixin's and 
fresh watermelon. 

Cindy and Charlie are 
home to see everyone, 
and Charlie brings col-
leagues from Washington 
to see the 17th District that 
he's so proud to represent. 

Asoemlont Haskell 
Form Road 600 

Si smford 

ti 
92 

Hamlin 

	 Farm Road 142 

Stenholm Fenn. 
Ericksdahl • 

HA_ 	Picnic Grounds 
▪ t  

rtil  

MOO 

Directions to 
Albeny 

PUNDIT 	 Abilene 

For more Information: 
Stenholm for Congress 
P.O. Box 1032 
Stamford, TX 79553 
Phone: 915/773-5521 

Paid for by Stenholm for 
Congress Committee 

evtAt SOUTHWEST 
LOOK! 

IS HERE  
(ON DISPLAY) 

• Pottery 
• Figurines 
• Plants 
• Wall 

Hangings 
• Draperies 

And 
Lots More! 

BELL DRAPERIES  
1706 W. Commerce (Hwy 80 W.) 

Eastland 	629-1319 

FRILLS 
1938 N. 1st 	Abilene, Tx 

673-2114 

Specializing In 
Frilly Dresses 

Ruffles & Lace 
CanCans, Petticoat 

Bows & Panties 
To Match 

Large Selection 
Open 

Thurs., Fri. & Sat. 
10 a.m. - 5 p.m. 

552 

Downtown Baird 
(Next To Opry Theatre) 

• Orders To Go • 
Come & Eat With Us 

Before Attending 
Johnny Lackey's 

Saturday Nite OPRY 
Senior Citizens Discount 
Open: Fri. 11:00 a.m. - 9:00 p.m. 

Sat. 4:00 p.m. - 9 p.m. SIW 

130 'BB . 

Bar-B-Que 
Plates 

Sandwiches 

Brisket 

Ribs 
Sausage 

Ham 

• 1/2 Day Photo Finishing • 
Commercial 
	

Photo Buttons 	Portraits 
Aerial 
	

Weddings 
Custom Framing 
	

Quality Frames 

COTTON'S STUDIO 
300 West 8th Street 
Cisco, Texas 76437 

30 Years Serving Eastland County 
Your Business Is Appreciated 

James Cotton 	5-73 	817/442-2565 

Eastland Telegram - Ranger Times - Cisco Press 
- Rising Star And Callahan County Star 

Thursday, September 7, 1989 Area News Briefs  
ing a float or decorated car. 
There will be a S25 prize for 
the best entry, and trophies 
for the First Place in each 
division. Please call the High 
School at 442-3051 for more 
information. 

EASTLAND 
Next Saturday, Sept. 9, will 

he "Teacher Appreciation 
Day" in Eastland. Merchants 
will be showing appreciation 
in various ways for the con-
tribution of teachers to the 
community. There will be 
"Teachers Appreciation Spe-
cials" in the stores, and some 
may also be advertised in the 
newspaper. 

Bullock Schoolhouse every 
Monday from September 
through May, beginning on 
Sept. 11 from 9 a.m. until 
2:30 p.m. Anyone interested 
in learning how to quilt is 
welcome to come and join the 
group. There will be a cov-
ered dish luncheon at noon. 
The historic old Schoolhouse 
is also available for family 
reunions. For further infor-
mation call Mrs. Charlie Beck 
at 653-2484 in ()Men. 

include Shawn Wells, Tom 
Dunn, Bill Walton and Ken 
Parrack. The sale of the notes 
has been cleared through a 
bonding company. The com-
panies being considered to 
come into Ranger would 
supply jobs to skilled people 
who must work outside the 
Ranger area to find jobs. This 
may include a Pasties Fac-
tory which can employ 100 
people. 

ham is the store manager. The 
colorful displays in the store 
include stuffed animals, dolls, 
decorative clothing and shoes, 
hats, quilts and afghans, wood 
crafts, baskets, and numer-
ous decorative items. There 
are also plans to stock 
craftmaking supplies. The 
store is open from 9 a.m. - 6 
p.m. on weekdays, and until 1 

p.m. Saturdays. 

charge for participants. It is 
hoped that prospective fathers 
as well as mothers will at-
tend. Highlights of the classes 
will include psychological 
and physical changes during 
pregnancy, do's and don'ts 
of pregnancy, how to meet a 
newborn baby's physical and 
emotional needs, and much 
other information on child-
birth and childcare. For fur-
ther information call the 
Hospital at 629-2601. 

The United Methodist 
Women from the Methodist 
Church will hold their annual 
rummage sale from 8 a.m. - 5 
p.m. Thursday and Friday, 
Sept. 7 and 8, in the Church's 
fellowship hall. 405 W. 8th 
St. There will he many good 
items for sale, and coffee., tea 
and homemade pie will also 
be sold and served. Don' t miss 
this big sale and the good pies 
these women bake. The 40 ft. by 80 ft. metal 

building under construction 
on West Main near the Co-
manche County Electric Co-
op building will be a truck 
garage for that company. Line 
Superintendent Johnnie Dye 
said that the electric supplier 
has outgrown its facilities, and 
the extra room is badly 
needed. Most of the new 
building will be used to get 
the big trucks out of the 
Weather, and the building will 
also be equipped as a truck 
maintenance facility. The new 
building is expected to be 
completed in late September. 

Super Duper 
Winner 

CISCO 
The City of Cisco approved 

a cutback on trash pickup, 
which will be the only de-
crease of services noticeable 
under a tightened budget. City 
Manager Mike Moore says 
that sanitation pickup will he 
cut back to once a week in 
residential areas. He added, 
"The changes coming about 
in solid waste requirements 
will end up costing the cities 
untold dollars. Therefore 
cutting back was going to 
happen, no matter what." The 
City will be able to give a 
small cost-of-living raise to 
employees, Moore said. He 
stated that the City has hard-
working employees and they 
deserve this increase in sal- 

Directors and members of 
the Ranger Chamber of 
Commerce have presented the 
Ranger City Council with a 
Resolution that the City act 
immediately to enforce legis-

lation to clean up the city, 
including requiring citizens 
to clean up their own prop-
erty or face stiff fines. Major 
priorities are clearing aban-
doned buildings, mowing of 
vacant lots, clearing out aban-
doned cars, lawnmowers, etc. 
and ridding downtown alleys, 
streets and sidewalks of 
weeds. 

RANGER 
The Ranger Industrial 

Foundation is alive and well -
and selling 550,000 worth of 
notes at 10 percent interest 
payable in 12 years. The foun-
dation hopes to secure money 
with these notes to help bring 
new businesses into Ranger. 
Jerry Jackson is Chairman of 
the Industrial Foundation 
Board, and Board Members 

The Bullock Quilting Club 
will be meeting at the old 

Margaret Beek won S100 
at Super Duper and there have 
been some S I winners also at 
theEastland store. The money 
was won with free cash lot-
tery cards which are given 
away in the store. 

Jim Andrews is the new 
pastor of the southside Bap-
tist Mission, located at 1508 
S. Seaman in Eastland. This 
is a Southern Baptist Mis-
sion, and sponsored by the 
Mangum Baptist Church. 
Pastor Andrews first came to 
Eastland as Youth District of 
the First Baptist Church, and 
has pastored at Ranger, 
Easiside, Kokomo, and Pleas-
ant Hill. The Mission Church 
on South Seaman is now 
meeting in a trailer house, 
and future plans include a 
larger location with a perma-
nent building. 

• 
ary. 

Dr. Chief Brown, 
Chiropractor, Is Now 

Accepting 
Medicare Insurance 

(And Participating Insurances) 

For Your Chiropractor Needs 

800 W. 6th, Cisco. 

817-442-1400 
	

By Appointment 
Emergency 
	

8 a.m. - 5 p.m. 
817-442-1071 
	

Mon., Tues., Wed. & Fri. 
CER72•RSB36 

Binger Arts and Crafts has 
opened at 109 West Main, on 
the north side of the Court-
house Square. OwnerJohnnic 
Binger makes and takes on 
consignment the items offered 
fbr sale, and Debbie Bing- 

Eastland Memorial Hospi-
tal is sponsoring a series of 
four Expectant Parent Classes 
to be held 7-9 p.m. on Sept. 7, 
14, 21 and 24 in the Teaching 
Conference Room of the 
Hospital. There will be no HOUSTON'S 

FABULOUS 

TideAn 
MOTOR INN 

6700 SOUTH MAIN 

Frank Young, City of Cisco 
employees for 15 years, has 
announced his retirement, 
effective Oct. 1. Mr. Young 
has been street superinten-
dent, and was also in charge 
of parks and sanitation. he 
has also served as water super-
intendent. City Manager 
Moore, in announcing 
Young's retirement, said: 
"Frank has provided a tre-
mendous amount of assis-
tance to me personally...and 
has helped the city over the 
years. I plant to utilize his 
talents even after his retire-
ment..." The Cisco City 
Council plans to honor Mr. 
Young with a certificate at 
the Council meeting on Sept. 
26. 

SUMMER 
DISCOUNT 

$3995  DBL. 
KIDS FREE 
12 g UNDER
• 	

 , 

BIG COUNTRY REAL ESTATE 
11011 /2  W. 12th 	Off. 442-1693 	Dana 442-3958 
4Bd corner, storage, carport, cellar, under $40,000. 
3Bd & 4Bd homes, some fenced, storage, extras, nice. 
New 3Bd Bk, 3 lots, o/carry, has potential, $35,000. 
2 Story homes, 1 w/pool, lg. lots, great locations. 
Fix Uppers, use as home or rental, reasonable, o/c. 
Farms & Ranches w/i or 2 homes, Pecans/fruit trees, 
bldgs, tanks, water, hunting, fishing, everything. 
Comm. Bldgs. - Lots - HUD - Lake Properties - Acres. 
Jeffrey 643-3129 	CER-RS-B 73 	Penny 442-1707 

AS TRDWORLDA ATERWORLD TICKETS 
AVAILABLE AT FRONT DESK 
EXCELLANT BUFFET AT REASONABLE 
PRICES 
BEAUTIFUL POOL AND GARDEN 
AREA 
CABANA ROOMS AND SUITES 
FREE PARKING 
RISING TIDES CLUB 
MAJOR CREDIT CARDS ACCEPTED 

The Cisco High School 
Student Council is planning a 
homecoming parade in down-
town Cisco on Sept. 29 at 3 
p.m. The Parade will begin at 
Third Ave. and Conrad Hil-
ton, and be a part of the week's 
homecoming activities. This 
will coincide with the foot-
ball game between the fight-
ing Loboes and the Bangs 
Dragons. Plans are being 
made for the parade to be an 
area-wide project. All are 
asked to participate by enter- 

2 -2ini HOUSTON,XAS 
Across From Texas Medical Center ismins, 

5 Minutes to Astrodome, Astroworld and Waterworld 
Rice Stadium—Zoo—Golf Course Fat Stock Show—The Summit 

Prater Equipment Co. 
Heavy Equipment Contractors 

Roads 	 Brush Work 
Utilities Dams Developments 

Free Estimates 
817-842-5878 817-842-5244 
No Job Too Small or Too Large  5 1C4 



We Will Meet Or Beat Any Competitive Prices. 

Call Toll Free 1-800-622-1752 
Discounts for Cash Delivery 

708 W. Main, Eastland 
(Across From H&R Lumber) 

629-1751 
After Hours 

Gavle - 629-2128 	Charles - 629-8614 

CISCO HOME FOR SALE 
3 Bd - 2 Bth Large Rooms Storage 
Corner Lot In Terrific Neighborhood 

Really Nice Yard Trees Shrubs 
Double Car Carport Garage 

Loaded With Extras Inside & Out 
Including A Moderate Price 

Big Country RE 	442-169537(  

CISCO AUTO TRIM 
AUTO UPHOLSTERY 	AUTO GLASS 

VINYL TOPS 	 FREE ESTIMATES 

	da. 

207 E. 9th 	Cisco, Tx 

817-442-4452 William Johnson 
171 

FAX Service - 24 Hour 
FAX # 817-442-4333 

COMPUTER PATCH 

GENERAL TYPING - WORD PROCESSING 

MANUSCRIPTS e REPORTS • PROPOSALS 
FORM LETTERS • LABELS • ETC.  

DORIS F. COZART 
442-3764 

308 E 20th 
CISCO. TEXAS 

CER73•R5037 

POSITIVE SYSTEMS 
All aspects of bookkeeping for Arc your computer programs 
your personal or company up and running? Have you had 
needs. Let me prepare your time to customize it to your 
paperwork in orderly, easy to needs? Need a data base set up? 
find files along with computer- Need a macro written or de-
lied printouts. Let me show you bugged? Does your mailing list 
what a good recordkeeping print to suit you? Your word 

system can mean for you! 
	processor? Let me help! 

442-4209 or 442-2740 
Personal Service Customized Especially For You! 

	
5.73 

TEXAS LONGHORN 
Breeding Age Bulls 
Pure Blood Lines 

817-442-4823 
Cisco, Texas 

If No Answer Please Call Back 

WESTERN AUTO ASSOCIATE STORE 
1201- Conrad Hilton Ave. Cisco, Tx 

Whirlpool & Roper Appliance Dealer 

4 Cycle Washer: $329." 
4 Cycle Dryer: '299." 

4 Cycle Dishwasher: '279." 
Refregerators: '549." & Up 

FREE DELIVERY 

- DOLIAR V HD iNG 
"Nintendo Headquarters 

for Eastland County" 
• Renting Games, Systems & Accessories 

• Over ISIQ Games To Choose From! 

On Sale Now: Skate or Die - Only $32" 
Batman Movie Merchandise 

813 Conrad Hilton Ave. Cisco 442-1998578  

WESTERN AUTO ASSOCIATE STORE 
1201 Conrad Hilton Ave. Cisco, Tx 

Good Selection of TV's & VCR's 

GE 25" Portable Remote TV: $349." 
RCA 19" Portable Remote TV: '399." 
Sharp 19" Portable Remote TV: '299." 

Magnavox 25" Console Remote 
TV: $549.00 

r 

Elite Beauty Salon  
Back To School Special 

Helene Curstiss Quantum Perms 

$20." 
Carmine Jessica 
Janet Mary Ann 

509 W. 2nd 442-1265 
574J  

BRITE-LIFE 

ALCOHOL 
Isopropyl 

16 oz. 

59• 

MOUTHWASH 
Peppermint 
or Mint 

24 oz. 	2.29 

CENTRAL DRUG 
N. Side of Sq2u9are2687stland, Tx 6   

45,000 Mile Steel Belted 
Radial Exxon Signature • 

Ride confidently on the Exxon Signature. Exxon's best with a 
45,000 mile limited tread warranty. This quiet highway tire has 
two stabilizer steel belts and 
polyester cord body plies to keep 
you going in all kinds of 
weather. 

TIRE 
SIZE 

REGULAR 
PRICE 

LESS $7.50 
REBATE 

P155/80R13 $47.02 $39.52 
P185/80R13 $52.81 $45.31 
P185/75R14 $55.78 $48.28 
P195/75R14 $58.66 $51.16 
P205/75R15 $64.04 $56.54 
P215/75R15 $69.14 $61.64 
P235/75R15 $79.37 $71J37 

All State & Local Taxes Apply, Mounting & Balancing Not Included. 

r 

CHECK THE QUANTITY OF TIRES PURCHASE') AND AMOUNT OF THIS REBATE APPLICATION 

	

fangs Signature & 	Atlas 
SigaMme' II 	 eloadh•wk OT 	Atlas Truck 	 Atlas LTD 

7 50 - ono tire 	$ 7 50 • one lee 	❑ $ 5 00 - One tira 	n $ 3 PO one tee 

	

$15 00 - two lees 	n $15 00 - Iwo brae 	0 $1000 two fres 	(-) 	OD . two Lin 

	

rl 122 50 oese wee 	0 $22 50 - tree lures 	0 1150- Wee 11•11 	r-I $ 900 thee tees 

	

$30 00 • lout lees 	I3 $30 00 - f0.1/ toes 	CI 120.00 • lour lees 	$17 00 fad Nos 
Message tone...we ftsCaces. • ady e" I. widen CONsecien rem Ins cr•-chass Oreci sore E non a mraagn 
(non Onintsilal Oro S.C. fore Er-n 

Alta,' Seasonally 	Atlas' Slivertree 4 PLEASE SEE REBATE 

RULES BELOW 
Rebate cannot be redeemed ,n S10,0 
end's licntIad 10 2 rebates (8 tees) 
Per household 

Exxon Signature a 	 Atlas Roadhavok OT 
Signature II 	 • 45.000 nets anhOpeled 
• Up 10 60,000 mile limited 	enlearie 

Iroadwear warranty 	• ProimanCe tread design 
• Our finest veal belted ,,dal • Sistred black aelewen 
• Ousel running with superior 	lettering on One ads. isised 

'radon in as weather 	white Wier ,bewail on Wee 
• Speed rated' . S. ' 

Atlas LTD 
• 25.000 mile anlicipated 

mdeage 
• All.weather design 
• Steel-Belled Radial 

Altos Sessonair• 
• 35.000 end*  'trailed 

IreikOwn" 'viers/fly 
• Duel 'unnine Sloe,  

benso conshuction 
• E•Ceseen1 all wean., 

1.11001 

Alba Inch The 
• light Truck, 
• RVs and Vans 
• Treceon Inn 

Atlas StIvertrec 
• 30.000 rnee antcypaled 

endear 
• FibenieSSI Beata 
• AV western design 

TO RECEIVE YOUR REBATE 'IOU MUST: 

beertle°".18.1iresillohrho:s1Qaiseidur 	

brand] 

'be"  " 

Ih 
co•POct -• 	inlyni 01 IOW 10 CO•POo and • me.'ensta 31  TWO re 

2 ')Mani Iron' the setting relation shechiral dated vales rattle 019* 
in 11/ The name end 4442 no of the newts,. r2) the type and the 
nurntet of Alias or Eaton lees pirehaleC1 and (3) (he Pleat Of Ptet-
A9Chernaemek)cesiedavauon page

from
e  Initethecti:TionileOunWiawreartry and Adlusirnent 

3 4-n11Plate the caner iele of (Ns coupon and mart&tong won the 
Original saNta 	stet and Proof ot Put chose horn each Or. to. 

Exxon Redemption Center 
Department 2691 
Lubbock, Texas 79491 

REGARDING TICS OFFER: 
A Mechanical repsoctuctione 04 the flies 'nevi one trot be liCCePled 
B Oiler vod where prohteled by tat o,  lased; veld only m the U S A 
C Oiler good on purchases made between UPC I. lilt end 

Oct. 31. 'gag. Rebate request must be poalmatessd by 
Noy. 15. 19119. 

0 Albs 9 weeks for recto' of reS$1d 
E Cash value 1904 
F Lim.1 2 rebates al fres/ pit household Multiple submission could 

rerun m feClei if Cetelifulice uncle. the U S Marl Fraud Statutes (19 
USC. Sections 1341 grid !JAZ and rl found q,rlly, a line of up to 
SI 000 and imprisonment or up toerve yews 

PROOF OF PURCHASE 
(Page 4 of the 
Warranty Agreement) 

J 

TIRES 
(Please punt UNIOY) 
Car Male FTTITFT-1-FTT- 
License Plebs No III I I I I  Li Stale LIA 

11111111111111111111111111 	MI 

=HMI  
II 

Nam* 

addrine 

City 

Siete 

AP4  h17  LL_LLJ  
III 	III II  Phone Z9 

Omar' s License No 

Dempsey Ross Exxon 
1-20 & FM 570 

Eastland, Tx 76448 

Bill Gregg Exxon 
400 E. Main 

Eastland, Tx 76448 

Cisco Exxon 
1-20 & Conrad Hilton Ave. 

Cisco, Tx 76437 

Quality you can count on. 751( Chirps it on yOur Ea itOn'taid Areserican 
Express! MasterCard' of visso 

9 • 

OXON 

Thursday, September 7, 1989 
owners of $30 million in lost 
property during the last year. 

"We have found more lost 
property for the citizens of 
Texas this year than the total 
found for all previous years 
prior to 1983, the first year I 
was in office," Richards said. 

"So far this year we have 
written checks returning lost 
property to more than 16,000 
Texans and we are finding 
more each day." 

The Richards Administra-
tion has collected S273.5 
million in unclaimed prop-
erty in the past six years, or 86 
percent of all unclaimed prop-
erty collected since the un-
claimed property law was 
passed in 1962. 

Of the S114 million re-
turned to owners during the 
past 27 years, the Richards 
Administration returned S110 
million or 96 percent. 

Poetic Verse State Treasurer Ann W. Richards Turns 
Over $40 Million To State Agencies 

In order to find owners of 
lost property, state law re- 
quires the Treasury to pub-
lish a statewide listing of those 
persons with $50 or more of 
unclaimed property each 
March. 

This year, the Treasury 
published a list of 110,000 
names of persons with more 
than S60 million in lost 
money. 

The state can use any 
money that remains un-
claimed for general state 
expenses and for education. 
This year S20 million went to 
the General Revenue Fund 
and S20 million to the Foun-
dation School Fund. 

While the state may use 
money while it remains un-
claimed, the owners or the 
owners' heirs may claim their 
property at any time in the 
future. 

hide 
There is one who is always 

near you 
Within His arms you can 

abide. 

So don't say that no one 
loves you 

And this world won't even 
care 

Just trust in the Lord eaell 
day 

He's no further away than 
a prayer. 

Bob Harbin 

SOMEONE LOVES 
YOU 

As we gaze across the val-
ley 

And see the wild flowers 
blooming there 

The sun setting in the west 
As if an answer to our 

prayers. 

State Treasurer Ann W. 
Richards Friday turned over 
$40 million in unclaimed 
money to state agencies to 
pay for schools, highways and 
other general state govern-
ment services. 

The money is from aban- 

doned checking accounts, 
uncashed cashier's checks, 
unclaimed utility deposits and 
the like for which no owners 
could be found. 

"This is one of the best 
sources of non-tax revenue 
for the state," Treasurer 

Richards said. "it has grown 
from virtually nothing in 1982 
to $40 million this year and 
each new dollar we collect is 
a dollar that we don't have to 
collect from our taxpayers." 

The state received a large 
amount of unclaimed prop-
erty earlier this week after the 
Treasury sold its unclaimed 
stock certificates for more 
than S4 million. 

In addition, auditors from 
the Treasury found Sll mil-
lion in heretofore unreported 
unclaimed property from 
various businesses in the state. 

Based on their job perform-
ance, the Texas State Auditor 
has prepared a report that 
shows Treasury Unclaimed 
Property auditors had the 
highest per audit hour return 
of any revenue collecting 
agency in state government. 

Richards said that while she 
was proud of the amount of 
unclaimed property collected 
and turned over to the state, 
she was even more proud of 
the fact that the State Treas-
ury had been able to find 

Lifestyle Change In Fire Ant 
Colonies Makes A Tough Job 

Each hair on your head is 
counted 

And He sees the sparrow 

How could we doubt that 
He knows us 

When He loves us one and 
all. 

Fire ants are increasingly 
difficult to eliminate because 
of a change in the life histo-
ries of fire ant colonies. They 
are appearing with multiple 
queens instead of single 
queens, according to a study 
conducted by the University 
of Florida's Institute of Food 
and Agricultural Sciences and 
the U.S. Dept. of Agriculture. 

These new colonies house 
as many as 200 queens per 
mound compared to single-
queen mounds. When the 
queen in a single-queen nest 
(lies, the entire nest dies; but 
when of the multiple queens 
die, the workers scatter. In 

Cisco Country Western Musical 

music will start at 7 o'clock. 
There is no admission 
charge, and all area musi-
cians are welcome. 

The regular Cisco Country 
Western Musical will be held 
Saturth , Sept. 9, in the Cor-
ral Room. Concession stand 
will orlon !4* 	n m anti the 

multiple-queen nests, fire ant 
workers have no loyalty to a 
single queen. This make 
eliminating the colonies even 
more difficult. 

The study, which found 30 
to 40 fire ant mounds per acre 
back in the days of single 
queens, now reports that there 
are up to 5,000 mounds per 
acre. Entomologists are still 
trying to determine whether 
the multiple-queen ants arc a 
hybrid or a different species 
altogether from single-queen 
ants. They hope that with 
more research, they'll be 
better able to understand -
and control - fire ants. 

REAL ESTATE NEEDS? 
Buying - Selling - Renting 

Check These Out! 
2 Story W/Pool Lg. Lot Mid 50k's 

3 Bd Home W/Workshop $6,500 
New Bk, 3 Bd 0/Carry $5,000 Down 
Rent: 3 Bd, Bk, & Frame Homes 

Big Country RE 442-16936  

Play Day School 
Preschool for ages 3 to 5 has a few 
openings for fall '89. Tuesday thru 
Friday, 9 a.m. to 12 p.m. Certified 

elem. ed. and Kindergarten teacher. 
Learning environment, arts and crafts, 

music, outside play, and more. 
Call 629-2416 for more information. 

When sorrow and trouble 
overtake you 

And you have no place to 

Summer Quarter Honor 
Rolls have been announced 
at Texas State Technical In-
stitute-Sweetwater,according 
to Dr. Clay Johnson, Campus 
President. 

Included on the honor roll 
are the names of TSTI stu-
dents from the Sweetwater 
Campus and the Abilene 
Extension. In order to be eli-
gible for the Dean of Instruc-
tion Honor Roll, the student 
must maintain a 3.5 to 3.99 
grade point average in all 
subjects for the quarter and 
can be enrolled either full-
time or part time. 

Among those listed on the 
Dean of Instruction's Honor 
Roll were: 

Howard E. Worley, Diesel 
Mechanics, Cisco; Robin L. 
Griffin, Diesel Mechanics, 
Eastland. 

Senator Bob Glasgow (D-
Stephenville) has been noti-
fied by the Office of the 
Governor, Criminal Justice 
Division, that Eastland 
County has been awarded 
three grants. 

The grants arc as follows: 
$3,502.00 for DA's Man-

agement System; $4,090.00 
for District Clerk's Manage-
ment System; $3,502.00 for 
Sheriff's Management Sys-
tem. 

"I commend the citizens of 
Eastland County," stated 
Senator Bob Glasgow, "in 
their continued effort to im-
prove the safety and well-
being of every individual in 
this area." 

Exxon 
Horn Marketing Inc. 
Up To $30.00 Rebate 



Barbara Love, Inc. 

ouitte  
Gourdeste 

REAL ESTATE 

Highway 80 East ANN WILLIAMS 
REAL ESTATE 

610 Conrad Hilton Ave., Cisco 

442-1880 
Business & Home Phone 

CISCO HOMES 
Investment Opportunity! Homes priced under $10,000. 
Take Advantage and Invest in this 2 BR home, DR, CH/ 

CA, nice sized rooms, carport, storage. 
Do Not Hesitat " tome, just repainted, new 

carpet, workshop,1  S 01 4 n  ced to $16,500. 
Quiet Setting! 2 BR brick home, 4 lots, excellent work-

shop, water well, shade t 
Cozy 3 BR, 13/4  bath 	D ports, corner lot. 
Reasonable-Reasonable. , 'umerous 2 or 3 BR homes 

priced under $20,000. 
Beautiful Wood Floors in this 3 BR, 2 bath home, new 

cabinets, carport, covered patio. 
Discover Country Living with City Conveniences - 3 BR, 

0 bath home, CH/CA, Plus mother-in-law home, water 
well, 13 lots. 

Look me Over! 3 BR, 13/4  bath Rock Home, CH/CA, 
located on 3 lots. 

Don't Miss This - 3 BR brick home, formal DR, CH/CA, 
carport, covered Patio, 2 storage buildings. 

Spacious Rambling 2 story home, 10 rooms, 2 baths, on 
corner lot, many large shade trees. 

Try This One For Sim & Price! 4 BR, 2 bath, 2 story home, 
DR, LR, large rooms. Reduced to $29,500. 

Spacious Inside & Out! Lovely 3 BR, 04  bath home, CH/ 
CA, modern kitchen, breakfast nook, DR, workshop. 

Find Family Fun! 4 BR, 3 baths, LR, DR, Gameroom, Den 
with fireplace, 3 car carport, CH/CA. 

All the Space you 
sOLD 	 

nming Pool with this 3 
BR, 2 bath brick horn 	 0. 

Quiet Neighborhood! Roomy 3 BR, 13/4  baths, formal DR, 
breakfast nook, double garage & workshop. 

1908 Sears Catalog Home-2 Story plus basement, central 
heat, 168' x 155' corner property. 

Custom Built! 3 BR, 2 bath brick, CH/CA, fireplace, 
double garage, 4 fenced lots, many extras. 

Water Lovers! This Home is the Answer! 3 BR, 3 baths, 
CH/CA, Firpelace, Covered Patio, Boat Dock. 
LAKE CISCO AREA: Unbeatable prices! Some with Water 
frontage & Private Docks - Homes & Cabins. 
MOBILE HOMES: Within Your Means! 3 BR, 2 baths, on 
2 lots, starting at $12,500. 
HUD HOMES: Call for Information. 
RESIDENTIAL LOTS: Take the First Step toward building 
a new home. 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES 
Well maintained downtown office building with CH/CA. 
Easy access - spacious building - only $12,500. 
Medical Offices, Professional Bldg. Will accomodate 2 

physicians, Near Hospital, large parking area, CH/CA. 

ACREAGE AND COUNTRY HOMES: 
Spectacular View! 3 BR, 23 /2  bath brick home, CH/CA, 

multiple features on 3.64 acres. 
Near Cisco, approx. 29 acres,  2 tanks, pecan orchard. 
Home Site, Ap SOLD es, 1-20 frontage, 2 tanks. 
Country Livin 

SOLD   
BR, 13/4  bath brick home, 

CH/CA, 80 acres, tk, Westbound Water. 
Privacy - 3 B , 13/4  bath home on approx. 135 acres, 

several outbuildings, 2 tanks plus 2 water wells. 
Great for Hunting! 160 acres, mostly wooded, small field, 

tank, creek - only $390. per acre. 
Lots of Living Space - 4 BR, 2'/2  bath brick home, CH/CA, 

fireplace, 3 water wells, 3 tanks, on 160 acres. 
In Ranger Area - Spacious 4 BR, 2 bath Austin Stone 

home, CH/CA, on approx. 190 acres, mostly wooded. Will 
consider selling home and acreage separate. 

Ann Williams 	Cathy Wallen 
Broker 	 Associate 
442-1880 	CERRS 104 	442-2120 

PAT MAYNARD REAL ESTATE 
WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS!! 

MAYNARD BUILDING HWY. 80 EAST EASTLAND, TEXAS 
Bath, Form al Living & Dining rms., office, den, huge 
gameroom, and Fantastic Kitchen w/EVERY-
THING! $ix Figures. 

HUD HOMES available in Eastland, Cisco, & 
Ranger. We have keys & information. Equal Hous-
ing Opportunity. 

ATTENTION FIRST TIME HOME BUYERS! 
Bond Money available for 8.69% interest loans. 
One-Half Million Dollars available to our area on 
FIRST COME, FIRST SERVE basis. Call us Today! 

One Of A Ki nd, Crestwood Addition, Residential 
Lot, 75' x 150', $6,000. 

A Rare Find! Residential Lot In Lovely Hillcrest 
Addition, $10,000. 

Valley View Addition, Two Remaining Residen-
tial Lots, 90' x 150' lot for $5,000; and 112' x 150' 
Corner lot for $6,000; or buy together for $10,500! 

Four Residential Lots near schools & Little Store, 
$10,000 for all. 

Eight Residential Lots, Southwest Eastland, 
$2,500 to $5,500. 

125' x 140' Wooded Lot w/Mobile Home Hookup, 
$8,000. 

03480 ac lot on North Lamar St. $3,000. 
20' x 28' Metal Bldg., Concrete Floor, Natural. 

Gas, Electrical Outlets, on 70' x 110' Lot, $11,000. 
If you have a fascination for Vintage Homes 

Approx. 100 yrs. old, you will love this 2.'Story, 
Charmer! Approx. 1900 sq. ft., Some Remodeling 
Already done (pretty wallpaper, etc.), Beautiful 
Corner Lot, plus nice Garage Apt. Needs some work, 
but look at this LOW Price! $22,000. 

629-8568 
EASTLAND HOMES AND LOTS 

Immaculate 3 BR, 2 Bath, 2-Car Garage, Brick 
Home in Oak Hollow, Outstanding Dec or Featuring 
Carpet, Drapes & Miniblinds, Wallpaper, Builtins, 
Central Heat & Air, Ceiling Fans, Fireplace w/Heat-
0-Later, Bookshelves, Covered Patio, Privacy Fence, 
& More! $65,000! 

12 big oak trees surround this comfortable home 
situated on 4 Lots w/backyard gazebo, barbeque pit, 
& plenty of room for a Volleyball Net. The house is 
a large 2 BR w/full attic for 3rd bedroom or 
gameroom, detached garage w/bath & extra room 
and all kinds of storage! Also extra water meter on 
one of the lots ideal for mobile home rental, All this 
for $28,500! 

Just Listed - Pretty 3 BR, Pi, Bath Brick Home, 
Central Heat & Air, Carpet, Drapes, Builtins, 6 
Ceiling Fans, Fireplace, Privacy Fence, plus 3 Addi-
tional Lots! $43,500. 

tow Equity & Possible Assumption on this large 
two-story brick home, 3 BR, V/4  bath, central heat & 
air, separate living areas, privacy fence, corner lot, 
excellent neighborhood, $55,000. 

You Will Be Amazed At What $24,000 will buy! 
Comfortable 2 BR Frame Home on corner lot, car-
pet, drapes, dishwasher, storm windows, storage 
bldg., 3-car carport, big patio, fenced backyard. 

Perfect For A Big Family, large 5 BR, 31 /, Bath, 
Brick Home on Corner Lot, Separate Living Areas, 
Formal Dining Rm.,Upstairs Studio, Atrium, Ga-
rage Apt, & More$85,000. 

Live The Good Live in this Charming 3 BR, 1'/, 
Bath, Brick Home on 2.67 ac., Super Location just 
minutes from town, carpet, drapes, builtins, wallpa-
per, CH/CA, beautiful patio & deck, $78,500. 

We have a Brand New Home on Lovely S. Sea-
man Street in need of a nice family! Home features 3 
BRs., 2 Baths, Large Closets, Builtins, Plush Carpet, 
Corner Lot, $63,000. 

On A Scale Of I to 10, This would be an II! 
Gorgeous Log/Stone/Glass Home situated on 3.77 
heavily wooded acres, approx. 3,000 sq. ft. of Luxu-
rious Living Space With All The Extras! Make 
Appointment To See. 

A Hop, Skip, & Jump to Elementary School from 
this 3 BR, 11/2  Bath, Brick Home, Central Heat & Air, 
New Carpet, Drapes, Privacy Fence, Barns & Pens, 
$45,000. 

Rustic 3 BR, 2 Bath, Cedar Home situated on 
approx. 1 ac. near Golf Course, Light & Bright 
Large Open Living Area, Wallpaper, Central Heat 
& Air, Fireplace, Carpet, Miniblinds & Shades, 
$68,500. 

No Brag, Just Fact! One Of The Nicest 3 BR, 2 
Bath, Doublewides We Have Seen! 3 BR, 2 Bath, 
Carpet, Drapes, Sky-Lite, Fireplace, 2 Car-Carport, 
Approx. 1 ac., $38,500. Must See! 

Owner Says SELL! Extra Nice Brick Duplex, 2 
BR, 2 Bath, on each side, Ideally Located near Schools 
and Grocery Store, Carpet, Central Heat & Air, 
$55,000. 

Attractive 2 BR Frame Home, Central Heat & 
Air, Patio, Fenced Backyard, Ceiling Fans, Pecan 
Trees, $30,000. 

High Prices Are History! Large 3 BR, 2 Bath, 
Central Heat & Air, Carpet, Formal Dining, De-
tached Garage, Fenced Yard, Corner Lot, $29,500. 

Handy Location Just Off Main Hwy., Real Neat 
3 BR Frame, COOL refrigerated air, fenced yard, 
storage shed, $23,000. 

Country Living Near Town & Lake Leon, 3 BR, 
2 Bath, Brick Home situated on 9.67 ac. pasture land, 
Central Heat & Air, Fireplace, Formal Dining Rm., 
$65,000. 

Close In & Convenient, Popular Duplex w/2 BRs. 
on each side, or could easily be turned into 4 BR, 2 
Bath Home. $27,500,  

Spacious 3 BR, 2 Bath Brick Home in Exclusive 
Oak Hollow Area, two central heat & air units, 
fireplace, builtins, wet bar, garden tub, Shown By 
Appointment. 

Southern Charm, Stately Two-Story, Huge Oak 
Trees, approx. 13 Scenic Acres, Contract Pending, 
but will take "back-up". Owner Anxious. 

Roomy 3 BR, P/4  Bath on large corner lot, new 
carpet throughout, central heat & air, custom drapes, 
formal dining, big kitchen w/breakfast area, $60,000. 

Beautiful Briarwood, 4 BR, V/4  Bath, Brick Home, 
Corner Lot, Separate Living Areas, 2 CH/CA Units, 
Fireplace, Ceiling Fans, Privacy Fence, $64,000. 
Contract Pending, but looking for " back-up",Owner 
Transferred. 

Fixer-Upper, Good-Sized Rooms give this 3 BR 
Frame lots of possibility, near grocery store & bar-
ber shop, $16,000 OBO. 

If You've Got $750 and A-1 Credit you can 
assume VA Loan on this Cute 2 BR Home, Close In, 
Monthly Payments $333. 

Owner Will Finance w/Small Down Payment, 
Sunshine Yellow 3 BR Home, Detached Garage, 
Storm Cellar, Fenced Backyard, Big Trees, $18,500. 

Bricked 3 BR, PI, Bath, Mobile Home, 14' x 72' 
w/additional room bulk on, central heat & air, appli-
ances, assumable loan! $23,500. 

Escape To The Country, Nice Two-Story Brick 
Home on approx. 10 ac., 3 BR, 21/2  Bath, Approx. 
3,000 sq. ft., Central Heat & Air,Covered Patio, 
Storage Bldg. & Boat Shed, $85,00. 

Like New Inside, 3 BR, 2 Bath, Central Heat, 
Ceiling Fans, Carpet, Builtins, Storm Windows, 
Beautiful Kitchen Cabinets, Large Shop Bldg., 
$33,000. 

Residential or Commercial, 2 BR Frame Home 
has big rooms including formal dining rm., utility 
rm., storm cellar, fenced backyard, 2 lots, $13,500. 

Home On The Hill, Ideal Location, 3 BR, 2 Bath, 
Frame, Refrigerated Window Units, Woodburning 
Stove, Dishwasher, pretty patio, $27,000. 

Desirable South Seaman Street, 2 BR Frame w/ 
Siding, Carpet, Storm Windows, New Privacy Fence, 
Screened Porch, Nice Trees, $29,500. 

Drive Three Miles For Peace & Quiet, and the 
Serenity of this pretty 3 BR, 2 Bath Home on 12.9 ac. 
of beautiful coastal, Completely Fenced, City Water 
plus Well, 16' x 20' Shop Bldg., $64,900. 

Like New! Completely Remodeled 3 BR, 21/, 
Bath Home on 6.2 Wooded ac., Approx. 1900 sq.  ft., 
$68,500. 

This Secluded 3 BR, 21/2  Bath, Brick Home hid-
den away on 93 ac. right here in Eastland is a real 
bargain for $60,000. Fenced & Crossfenced. 

Executive Home, Words Can't Describe This 
Massivawo-Story Brick Home located in Eastland's 
Finest Subdivision, Approx. 5,000 sq. ft., 4 BR, 31/2  

R.G. (BUCK) WHEAT 
BROKER 

KAY BAILEY 
ASSOCIATE 

6294S60 

LAKE LEON AND OTHER 
LOCAT IONS 

Lake Leon, Nice 2 BR Brick Home on Deeded 
Lot, Central Heat & Air, Staff Meter, Fireplace w/ 
Heat-o-Later, plus one-bedroom house on property, 

$591,5201(e.  Leon, Near Lone Cedar, 2 Lake Lots, ap-
prox. 100' water frontage, Staff Water Meter, plus 
Travel Trailer on property, $35,000. 

Lake Leon, 6 lake lots near La Mancha area, 
water frontage, $6,000 each. 

Lake Leon, La Mancha Area, Lake Lots priced 
from $2,500 to $12,000. 

Morton Valley, 3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick Home on 
approx. 10 ac., carpet, drapes, builtins, CH/CA Spa-
cious Kitchen, Nice Oak Trees, Good Fences, City 
Water, Stock Tank & Water Well, $120,000. 

Morton Valley, Comfortable 3 BR Home on 
approx. 13 ac., and as an added bonus there is also 
a Grocery Store on property. Excellent Location, 
$57,500.

co , 3 BR, PI, Bath Home, Central Heat & Air, 
Carpet,  Builtins,  Large Living Area, Sep. Dining 
Rm., Breakfast Area Off Kitchen, Fenced Yard, 
$49,500. 

Cisco, Lovely Two-Story Home.with Basement 
and Full Attic Close In, Ideal Family Home or could 
be used for good commercial location, $50,000 0110. 

Olden, Pretty 3 BR, 04  Bath, Brick Home on 
$a6p9p,r0o0x0.. 1 ac., CH/CA, Fireplace, Covered Patio, 

Olden, Secluded Pond beneath giant oak trees 
adds charm to this 2 BR Stucco, approx. 3 ac., 

Star, Residential Lot near School w/24' x 
$29, 500.3  

Rising 
11 

40' shop building, city water, plus water well, lots of 
trees, $4,500. 

Carbon, 3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick Home on corner lot, 
central heat & air, carpet, drapes, fireplace, beauti-
ful kitchen cabinets, like new! This is a Pretty House! 

Carbon, large Residential Lot, 1351 x 172', three 
big pecan trees, fenced on three sides, good location, 
$3,500. 

LAND: FARMS, RANCHES, & 
SMALL ACREAGE 

10 ac. off farm road 2526, mostly open, fenced on 
all but north side, $490 per ac. 

20 ac. near Lake Leon, mostly kline grass, 1 tank, 
fenced, Hwy. frontage, $1350 per ac. 

40 ac. S. of Cisco, nativepecans, hand-dug well, 
good fences on 3 sides, 1/2 minerals owned by seller, 
$775 per ac. 

78 ac. off Hwy. 80,1 tank, fair fences, 1/2 miner-
als, $450 per ac. 

14 ac. coastal near Eastland, county road front-
age on two sides, $12,500. 

34 ac. near Lone Cedar Country Club, native 
grass, oak trees, fenced, road frontage, $25,000. 

50 ac. Staff  Area, Lake Leo , heavily wooded, 
$400 per ac. 

75.5 ac., all wooded, good bursting, near Olden, 
$525 per ac. 

146 ac. pasture, oak trees, tarty, Hwy. frontage, 
fenced, some minerals, $550 per ac.  

249.3 ac., Sabana River, two tanks, 1/2 minerals, 
140 ac. cultivation, oak & pecan trees, $450 per ac. 

26.15 ac., hwy. 80, Westbound Water, one tank, 
mostly all coastal, $21,574. 

40 ac. Wooded Tract, can be divided, owner 
finance, $36,000. 

50.6 ac. near Eastland Lake, creek, pecan trees, 
three tanks, coastal, pens, $42,504. 

120 ac. near Lake Leon, all pasture w/scattered 
oak trees, two tanks, running creek, lovegrass 
bluestem, 1/8 minerals, $595 per ac. 

166 ac., road frontage on two sides, good fences, 
some cultivation, trees, corrals, could be divided, 
$550 per ac. 

260 ac. near Scranton 3 water wells,  I  spring-fed 
tank, abt. 140 ac. cultivation, barn & shed, 2 oil wells 
- buyer to get 1/2 of sellers mineral rights, $475 per 
ac; Will divide for $525 per ac. 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 
Motel w/living quarters & two-story shop, Ideal 

set-up for storage units, mini•mall, etc. Just $8,000! 
Brick Building, formerly used at restaurant, but 

very versatile, $42,700. 
Prime Highway Frontage on Eastland's Hwy. 80 

East, probably the BEST location left, approx-2.5 ac. 
w/older house, $80,000. 

Modern Office Building on 1.20, Eastland, 8 
offices, kitchen/conference room, 2 rest rooms, cen-
tral heat & air, carpeted, 2,800 sq. ft., $75,000. 

We have three nice duplex apartments priced at 
$27,500, $36,500 and $55,000. There Is also a HUD 4-
plex available. Good Investment Properties. 

New Laundromat, & Acreage available on Hwy. 
80 East, Eastland. Please Call For Details. 

Busy Service Station, 2 Bays, Shop Building, 
Fully Equipped, Road Frontage on 2 sides, Ideal 
Eastland Loction. 

Buy All Or Part - Approx. 50 prime commercial 
acreage in the heart of Eastland's newest commer-
cial development. 

5,000 sq. ft. meltel building on approx. 2/3 tic., I-
20 Eastland, $76,000. 

We Welcome Your Listings! 
Thank You For Allowing Us To Serve You. 

WAYNE CHANDLER 	 DEBRA MAYNARD 
ASSOCIATE 	 ASSOCIATE 

7344782 	 6294013 

Eastland County Resources 
Assoc. To Meet September 12 Free Trees 

Extension Homemaking 
Council To Meet Sept. 6 

The Eastland County Re-
sources Association will meet 
at 12 noon Tuesday, Sept. 12 
in Eastland Centennial 
Memorial Library on South 
Lamar. 

A slate of officers will be 
presented, and reports heard 
from agencies and individu-
als concerning how needs of 
food, clothing and housing 
are being met. 

This will be the first meet-
ing of the fall season for the 
group, a community-service 
organization which deals with 
critical needs of people in the 
County. 

( 

Thursday, September 7, 1989 
Fall activities will be dis-

cussed which will include 
hosting the annual Eastland 
Countywide Senior Citizen's 
Bazaar. 

The State TEHA Conven-
tion is in Corpus Christi on 
September 12-14. Elected 
voting delegates are Arleta 
Shirey, Ardythe Caldwell, 
and Hazel Barron. Alternate 
elected is Frances Bishop. 

ing of the fall. 
Committee reports will 

include an update on the 
Extension Homemaker Cook-
book progress by Rena Kirk. 
The program committee will 
distribute the"Program Inter-
est" surveys for the 1990 
yearbook. 

The Extension Homemak-
ers Council will meet on 
Wednesday, September 6 at 
1:30 p.m. in the Eastland 
National Bank Community 
Room. Mrs. Wynelle Brown, 
is chairman, and encourages 
all club delegates and presi-
dents to attend the first meet- 

Plans will be made for as-
sistance, as well as programs 
to inform the public of chari-
table needs. The Resource 
Association will also begin 
up-dating the Community 
Service list published in the 
Eastland County Newspa-
pers. 

Individuals as well as rep-
resentatives from Churches 
and other organizations in the 
County are encouraged to 
attend the meeting Sept. 12. 
Bring a sack lunch if you wish. 4-H News 

opportunities. County, (Fredericksburg). 
Her many 4-H accomplish-
ments include: 4-H Houston 
Scholarship winner (58,000), 
IFYE Exchange 4-H'er to 
England, and attended 4-H 
Congress. 

Youth in grades 7-12 are 
invited to join this club. Par-
ents are invited and urged to 
attend to learn more of 4-H 

The Eastland Sr. 4-H Club 
will be meeting on Tuesday, 
September 12th, from 7-8 
p.m. in the TU Electric Reddy 
Room in Eastland. 

Mrs. Rhonda Eckert, a new 
resident of Eastland, will 
present a program on "Tak-
ing Advantage of 4-H Oppor-
tunity”. Rhonda is a former 
4-H member from Gillespie 

EASTLAND JR, 4-H 
CLUB TO MEET:  

All youth 3rd grade through 
6th grade are invited to join 
the Eastland Jr. 4-H Club! 

The Eastland Jr. Club will 
be meeting Tuesday, Septem - 
tier 5th, at 5:30-6:30 p.m. in 
the TU Reddy Room. 

The program will be on 
`afety". 

will meet on Saturday, Sep-
tember 9th at the TU Electric 
Reddy Room in Eastland from 
7-8:30 p.m. 

The 4-H,Recreation Team 
is in charge of the program. 

Plans will be made forsome 
important activities coming 
up this fall. All eligible 4-
H'ers who are 13 years of age 
and older, and who have been 
in 4-H 2 years, arc urged to 
attend. 

Parents are urged to attend 
and be informed and involved 
in 4-H. 

Mrs. Debra Herrera and 
Mrs. Vicki Seay are the club 
managers. 

EASTLAND COUNTY  
,IR. LEADER'S TO MEET:  

The Eastland County 4-H 
Junior Leader's Association 

EASTLAND SR, 4-11  
CLUB:  

Ten free trees will be given 
to each person who joins The 
National Arbor Day Founda-
tion during September, 1989. 

The free trees are part of 
the nonprofit Foundation's 
efforts to encourage tree 
planting throughout America. 

The trees will be shipped 
postpaid at the right time for 
planting between October 15 
and December-10 with en-
closed planting instructions. 

To become a member of 
the Foundation and to receive 
the free trees, send a $10 
membership contribution to 
TEN TREES, National Ar-
bor Day Foundation, 100 
Arbor Avenue, Nebraska 
City, NE 68410, by Septem-
ber 30, 1989. 

WEST TEXAS FAIR:  

The West Texas Fair opens 
tip this coming week and 
many Eastland County 4-
H'ers will be on "hand" with 
their animal projects. 

Best wishes and good luck 
to the following: 

Jeremy and Jessica Keith, 
Karl and Telitha Winge, 
Lyndee Groce, Rusty Rober- 

son, David Adams, Stephen 
and Kimberly Reich, Jeremy 
Castleberry, Christine 
Woolverton, Ryan Hunt, 
Garrett and Grayson Ger-
hardt, Matthew Schaefer, 
Hanna and Miriam Nicks, 
Billy Bob and Jeremy Orsagh, 
April and Morgan Moylan. 

Ricky Agnew, Nimrod 4-
H'er, is entered in the West 
Texas Fair Calf Scramble. 
Good luck Ricky on catching 
that calf! 

The Next Best Thing - 

...to a clear conscience and a good night's sleep is the feeling of security 
in owning your own home with a clear title. Peculiar to the real estate field, 
values are based on land and the improvements thereon, if any. But values 
on these are based on the title. The title then comes the most important item 
to be considered when purchase of real property is contemplated. So be 
careful to buy good title based on an abstract of title or a policy of title 
insurance. 

Eastland County 
Abstract Company, Inc. 

Eastland, Texas 
	

817-629-1077 

CERRS104 0019  

Remodeling - Siding 

Windows and Doors 
Jobbers for All Side 

Reynolds, Mastic and B.M.D. 
Siding, Windows, and Doors 
Also Remodeling & Add-Ons. 
Cover Facers and Overhang 
on Brick Homes. All Work 

Guaranteed. 
Call For Free Estimate. 

Butler & Fox 
Phone 629-2149 or 629-2814 

CER10.4 

Moving to Eastland County? Or 
anywhere in U.S.A. Call Toll Free 
1-800-525-8910 Ext. 4365 for 
information. (No Rentals Please) 

BIG COUNTRY REAL ESTATE 
11011/2  W. 12th 	Off. 442-1693 	Dana 442-3958 
Corner brick 3 bd, storage galore, fenced. 
3 Bd. large lot, minor finishing, $6,800. 
3 Bd. remod. on 5th, garage:2nd house. 
Nice large 2-story homes, Priced to move. 
165 Ac. 2 Homes, bldgs. water, cultivation, o/carry. 
72 Ac. Lg. Bk. w/pool, wooded, private, make offer. 
80 Ac. Pecan orchard, 2 homes, Extras, o/carry. 
HUD repos - Duplex - Lots - Comm. Bldgs., More. 
Jeffrey 643-3129 	 Penny 442-1707 CUSTOM 3BR, 3V., bath with beautiful lake view. 

Satellite dish, split bedrooms, Jacuzzi. MANY 
EXTRAS!HA4 
PRICE REDUCTION On this spacious 3BR, 21/, 
bath brick on 5 Ac. outside of Carbon. OWNER 
FINANCING!HA3 
CISCO:alai:on 1'/ Acres; City-sewer and water 
makes for country Jiving in the City!HA4 
40 ACRES WITH 21111 HOUSE-needs some re-
pairs. Land is cleared, sandy soil, some coastal, 
some minerals. Stock tank, city water well. EX-
CELLENT LOCATION!HA 21 
OAK TREES SURROUND 6'/ yr. old 2BR, 1 bath 
on 7.9 Acres. $10,000 down & Owner Fin ance!H A5 
SO. OF CARBON-This 3BR brick surrounded by 
oak trees sits on 60 Ac. Owner will split into smaller 
tract!HA6 
LUXURY CAN BECOME A HABIT in this 3BR, 
3 bath log home on 5 Ac. Large closet space; kit. 
built-ins. Nothing has been overlooked on this 
one!HA I 
OLDEN-3BR, 11/ bath brick on 2.2 Ac. Some 
coastal, 2 water viells!HA2 

ACREAGE 
LAKE LEON-EXCELLENT RECREATIONAL 
OR BUILDING SITE! Approx. 4 acres with high-
way frontage and lake frontage. Trees!A1 
SO. OF CISCO, 1 1 .5eanut cultivation, pas-
ture & wooded witlighway frontage.A3 
OWNER SAYS SELL-239 Acres, some coastal, 
brush, pasture, 3 tanks. Turkey, Deer & 
Mincrals.A 17 
92 ACRES - NEAR RANGER. Approx. 50 ac. 
coastal. 3 stock tanks, well & barn. Some minerals. 
Can pick up pmts. on 1981 mobile home.AS 
PRICE CUT IN HALF! Must sell this 8.9 Ac. in 
Carbon. City water & Some trees.A6 
SO. OF RANGER: 61.894 AC with County rd. 
frontage. Producing oil & gas well; will convey 1/4 
minerals.A15 
132 AC SE OF EASTLAND - native pasture & 
good deer cover. Hunter's cabin„ 2 tanks; oil & gas 
production & some minerals. WILL SPLIT!A13 
166 AC NEXT TO QUAIL RESERVE. Good bird 
& deer hunting! Stocked lake, tanks, water well. 
WILL SPLIT!A14 
LAKE LEON-20 ACRES mill, stock tank, barn, 
fenced. Adjacent deeded waterfront lotA8 
2 ACRES-MORTON VALLEY excellent building 
site. Water meter available. Highway frontage.A9 
EDGE OF EASTLAND, V, acres homesite - oak 
trees, city utilities available.A2 
5.2922 AC. LAKESIDE COUNTRY CLUB. Nice 
building site. Owner Finance!Al2 
HUNTER'S PARADISE on 1,990 Ac of mostly 
native pasture. Several tanks. Owner will split into 
smaller parcels!A16 
40 ACRES of coastal. Perimeter fencing, tank & 
some minerals which owner will transfer.A18 
CAR BON AREA: 118.5 Ac.Fenced & cross-fenced, 
3 tanks, & equip. shed. Some minerals.A19 
224 AC SO. OF CARBON: Part brush, approx. 30 
ac. in coastal. 2 tanks, fenced & cross-fenced. Some 
mincrals.A20 
320 AC, CAR BON: improved grasses & cult. Fenced 
& cross-fenced, 5 tanks. Some minerals.A21 
WEST OF DESDEMONA-20132 Ac. Wooded, 
small mountain - Excellent hunting for deer, tur-
key and quail. Some cult.A22 
79 AC N. OF GORMAN - good bottom land. Some 
cult. Numerous pecan trees, small tank. 
MINERALS!A23 
160 AC, S. BRECKENRIDGE • Approx. 90 ac 
Improved grasses; remainder native pasture with 
scattered trees. 2 tanks!A24 
220 ACRES, N. of Eastland - native pasture, mes-
quite & oak, 2 tanks. Hwy. & county road 
frontage.A25 
35 AC, EAST OF TOWN-Pasture w/improved 
grasses; stock tank & water well. Some royalty.A4 
HERE IT IS!! 16 Ac. on pavement near Eastland. 
Fenced, beautiful oak trees. BE QUICK!All 
296 AC NORTH OF CISCO-Native pasture with 
Hwy. & Cnty Road frontage. 3 tanks; good 
hunting!A26 
71/, ACRES IN OLDEN-completely fenced and set 
to "build on, including satellite dish. Some fruit 
trees.A27 
GOOD LOCATION-2 Ac. tract in Pogue Indus-
trial Park.A28 
SOUTH OF CARBON, 160 AC.-Approx. 40 ac. in 
field 1v/balance in pasture. Good dove and deer 
hunting.A29 

Broker - 	Eastland, Texas 76448 

629-1725 	629-8391 
EASTLAND 

WANT THAT COUNTRY FEELING in Town? 
Like New, 311112  2 Bath Dbl. Wide. Cen. H/A, 
Fenced yard, private patio. PRICED RIGHT!E9 
NEAT, FRAME 2BR, 1 bath home with possibili-
ties. Fenced yard, large steel building. PRICE 

:..14EDUCED!E2 
NEW DECOR in linnefivss for this 3BR, 2 bath 
home in Oak HollormaifillOn. Special financing.E4 
THIS 311111  1 bath Frame needs some work & is 
PRICED I() SELL!E7 
E-Z TO BUY this 2BR, 1 bath house. Newly remod-
eled with low monthly payments.E31 
PRICE DRASTICALLY REDUCED for quick sale! 
Beautiful 4 yr. old 3BR, 2'I bath home in exclusive 
neighborhood. Built-ins throughout. Professional 

-landscaping, sprinkler sys. & MORE.E35 
- AFFORDABLECRESTWOOD HOME-Spacious 

3BR,  2 bath, beautiful kitchen, sunken LR, sauna, 
muc more. CALL TODAY!E36 
COUNTRY LIVING IN TOWN! Nearly new large 
custom home. Heat pump, rock fireplace, office. 
Beautiful oak covered 1°1E23 
STOP! Look at this budget S-T-R-E-T-C-H-E-R! 
2BR in nice neighborhood. Under $15,000.00.E1 
GREAT PRICE & LOCATION for growing fam-
ily. Needs some work, 3111R, 2 bath.E38 
PRICE LOWERED on this 3BR, 2 bath Frame. 
Beautifully landscaped, well-kept home.E3 
TREE COVERED lot & custom 3BR, P/, bath 
home.3 cargar., sprinkler sys, sun room & More! E8 
LIKE A SHADY DEAL? Try this 2BR VI, bath 
frame home on a tree shaded lot. " Nice 
Neighborhood!El 1 
STORAGE GALORE in this 3BR, 2 bath home 
with sunken den. 4 car carport and workshop. 
NICE!E29 
VACANT LOT - COMMERCIAL AREA, near 
downtown. Frontage on N. Lamar, access from 
Patterson St. Owner will finance.E30 
ON A BUDGET? PRICE REDUCED on this af-
fordable 2BR, 1 bath home • lg. living area, garJ 
ca port.E25
SHADED CORNER LOT - 2BR, 1 bath frame. 
Central heat, metal stg. bldg.E6 
2 LOTS LOCATED close to park. Ideal bldg. site 
for family with younger children.E28 

- WHAT YOU HAVE BEEN WAITING FOR: Brick 
3BR, P/ bath in the 40's.E5 
EDGE OF TOWN • 3BR, 2 bath frame on approx. 
1 Ac. Completely redone; Cen. h/a, tree covered 
lot.E16 
OVERLOOKING EASTLAND - 3BR, 11/4  bath 
brick; beautifully landscaped. Kit. built-ins, welk-
in closets Cen. H/A & MORE!E17 
CHARMING COTTAGE - 2BR & small Den or 
could be 3 BR, 1 bath; formal dining, Cen. WA, & 

-freestanding F/P.E18 
CHOOSE YOUR FINANCING, FHA-VA-CONV. 
Large 3BR 

  

1 bath home with Cen. H/A, fireplace, 
stormym windows & More!E20 
GOODBUYFOR 	'ER UPPER. 5BR, 4 
bath Frame. Det. 	El0 
WHY RENT-Own this neat & freshly painted 31112, 
1 bath home. Cen. h/a; Stove & refrigerator!E22 

OTHER 
TWO HOMES IN RISING STAR - 20R, 1'/, bath 
frame & 41114, 1 bath frame. Both in need of 
repairs:07 & 08 
RANGER-3BR, 2 bath Brick on nice lot. F/P, Cen. 
H/A, Kit. built-ins.05 
CARBON cozy 3BR, 2 bath on nice lot.022 
OWNER TRANSFERRED! 3BR, 	bath brick. 
Storm windows, new appliances & More! Only 
$36,000.00.04 
OLDEN-A REAL DELIGHT! Neat, well-kept 2BR, 
I'/ bath with den or 3rd BR, on large lot. FHA-VA-
CONV. Financing.01 
CISCO-This 31111, W. bath home is not only well 
designed, but has large, beautiful kitchen. A MUST 
SEE!O22 
RANGER: CORNER LOT! 3BR, 2 bath frame. 
Total elec,. Att. gar, coy. patio. Low 30's!03 
CISCO-LET'S TALK TERMS! FHA, VA or 
CONV. financing to qualified buyer. Nice 3BR, 
Pi, bath brick, cen. H/A. PRICED TO SELL in low 
30's. 

COMMERCIAL 
EXCELLENT LOCATION - Store with 1680 sq 
ft., kitchen, Cen. H/A. S trl. spaces located in back 
on seperate meters w/all utilltles.C7 
153' OF I-20 ACCESS FRONTAGE, near Eastland 
with 2.5 ac. & office. Excellent set up for oilfield 
business.C3 
LAKE LEON AREA-Store w/3BR, 1 bath home. 2 
underground fuel tanks. Hookups for 4 mobile 
homes & 7 campers. PRICED RIGHT!CS 
PRIME LOCATION On Miracle Mile for this 
50.05 Ac tract. Suitable for any type of 
development!C8 
NEW LAUNDROMAT-excellent location.20 wash-
ers, 10 dryers. Equipped with all the 
conveniences.C9 
FANTASTIC LOCATION Next to Skinny's. 24 x 
14 office bldg. sitting on 60 x 160 paved & fenced 
lot.C1 BARBARA LOVE CINDYE FOSTER SHELLY RICKEY ROSEMARY FERGUSON 

647.1397 	629-8227 	629.3614 	653-237$ 

HOUSE & ACREAGE 
PRICE REDUCED on this large 2BR, 2 bath home 
situated on 1.4 Ac. GREAT BIAIHA14 
PRICE REDUCED-4BR brick on 225 AC or will 
split 10 ac & house. Some cult, peanut quota & 
more. NW of Desdemona.HA11 
198 ACRES with early 1900's home •joins Eastland 
City Limits. EXCELLENT TO S UBDI VI DE! Hwy. 
frontage. rustic trees.HA8 
32 ACRES m/I with 3BR home, access to Lake 
Leon. Staff water & well, stock tank, barn, shed. 
producinggas well, ' roalltA17 

	

MSIEW" 31TR, 	brick on 4 acres "NEAR 

	

surrounded by oak trees 	place!HA19 
BARBARA BOSTICK 

442-3822 



elt• WILDCAT TALES 
RISING STAR HIGH 

JOURNALISM 

1989 Wildcat Football Schedule 
PATE TEAM PLACE TIME 
Sept.1 	 Baird 	 Away 	 8:00 
Sept. 8 	 Santo 	 Away 	 8:00 
Sept. 16  	Santa Anna* ..Home*  	8:00 
Sept. 22  	Eden 	 Home 	 7:30 
Sept. 29  	Tolar 	 Home  	8:00 
Oct. 6 	 Rochelle  	Away 	 8:00 
Oct. 13  	Gorman  	Away 	 8:00 
Oct. 20  	Lometa  	Home 	 7:30 
Oct. 27 	 Hico 	 Away 	 7:30 
Nov. 3 	 Evant**  	Home** 7:30 
Nov. 10  	Cross Plains ...Away 	 ,7:30 

*Homecoming **Parents' Night 

1989 Jr.Wildcat Football Schedule 
PATE TEAM PLACE TIME 
Sept. 21  	Santa Anna Away 	 6:30 
Sept. 28  	Tolar 	 Away 	 6:30 
Oct. 5 	 Rochelle 	 Home 	 6:30 
Oct. 12  	Gorman 	 Home 	 6:30 
Oct. 19  	Lometa 	 Away 	 6:30 
Oct. 26 	 Hico 	 Home 	 6:30 
Nov. 2 	 Evant 	 Away 	 6:30 
Nov. 9 	 Cross Plains Home 	 6:30 

Good blocking stopped Baird's ground game in scrimmage 

Thursday, September 7, 1989 

School Scoop 

Ankle Deep & Frisky Feet 

Wildcats vs Santo There 8 p.m. 

by Becky Walker 
The students of Rising Star 

Jr. High may not be too 
gung-ho about going back to 
the usual drear of classes 
and homework, but their an-
ticipation is soaring as 
another exciting season of 
junior football is about to 
begin. 

Together 	 the 
cheerleaders, pep squad, 
players and coaches are put-
ting all their efforts into 
making this season the best 
one ever. 

Spirit leaders Lisa 
Robinette, Christy Hughes, 

Queens 
of the Court 

by Shannon Stuteville 
The Rising Star High 

School Lady Cats are back in 
the gym in this 100 plus heat. 
Fifteen young ladies — fine 
young ladies I might add —
have been honing their skills 
in pursuit of another winning 
season - even more suc-
cessful than last season. 

Nine Lady Cats from the 
Bi-District Championship 
Team of '89 are back playing 
basketball this year. We are 
glad to have five new Lady 
Cats and hope they will enjoy 
playing with us. 

Veteran and new players 
include Senior members, 
Shannon Stuteville, Becky 
Walker and Kimberly 
Schwab; Juniors, Wendy 
Green, Kristi Morrow, 
Pamela Hollis, Patricia 
Pavon and Rachael Col-
eman; Sophomores, Gherda 
Williams, Jomy Clark, 
Stephanie Sizemore, Cheryl 
Robinette and Betty Jones; 
and Freshmen, Jo Linney 
and Mary Best. 

by Kristi Morrow & Wendy 
Green 

Rumor has it that the Lady 
Cats have higher ambitions 
in basketball. Can you 
believe they're not satisfied 
with just Bi-District? They 
want it all!! 

A few of our rough and 
tough Wildcats have let it be 
known that the Santo Kittens 
won't be the cat's meow this 
year!! 

The Annual Staff and Jour-
nalism classes are supposed-
ly pulling the wool over Mrs. 
Wood's eyes - she thinks they 
actually do work in her 
class! 

The cheerleaders are on 
the verge of "refusal to per-
form" unless the football 
guys admit that they can't 
win without 'em! 

The band is planning to 
prove they're not Big T's 
goof-offs anymore! 

As far as the teachers go -
they may even be getting a 
little soft this year! 

All of the above was writ-
ten in pure fun. 

Misti Bailey, Emily 
Stuteville and Heather 
Wright promise to do their 
part in boosting support for 
the Jr. Wildcats as they meet 
their first opponents, the 
Santa Anna Mounties. Their 
sponsoring teacher is Mrs. 
Hinnant. 

Our capable coaching 
staff, which includes Head 
Coach Nathan Allen and 
Assistant Coach Doyle 
Browning, have high pro-
spects for the new, upcoming 
team and have confidence 
that parents and fans will not 
be disappointed. 

Everyone, please be sure 
to take advantage of this op-
portunity to view the Jr. 
Wildcats and cheerleaders 
on their opening night, Sept. 
21, in Santa Anna at 5:30 
p.m. 

What's 
Going On? 

by Tami Vandivere 
Roadside trash was to be 

picked up by members of 
Future Homemakers of 
America in their pledged 
section of Highway 36 on 

•
Sept. 6. 

FHA members will board 
a bus bound for the West 
Texas Fair & Rodeo Satur-
day. 

The 	high 	school 
cheerleaders have been 
working hard for Homecom-
ing festivities. They would 
like to say a big "thank you" 
to Debra Stuteville for pain-
ting the run-thru signs for 
the football games. 

Golf Classic to Benefit March of Dimes 
672-DIME or Rob Barnhill at 672-3982. 

Social Services for Needy 
Available in Area 

# 
1989 

NAME 
Wildcat 

pos 
Roster 

Ha CLASS 
10 Brandon Geye QB 160 	10 
11 	Jimmy Evans 	QB 	145 	11 
20 	Cody Wilson 	WB 	130 	12 
23 	Lee DeLong 	WB 	160 	12 
24 	Brandon Carroll 	SE 	140 	12 
25 	Chad Hill 	TB 	140 	10 
32 	Tody Baker 	SE ...... ..... 140 	 9 
40 	Donny Alcorn 	FB 	200 	11 
44 	Derrick White 	TB 	210 	12 
51 	Duane Schwab 	OG 	185 	9 
52 	Roanen Barron 	OT 	280 	12 
60 ....... Toby Long 	C 	180 	12 
61 	Larry Hollis 	OG 	170 	11 
65 	Alan Havens 	TE 	200 	12 
68 	Brian Bailey 	OG 	185 ...... 	11 
69 	Matthew Harmon .... OG 	195 	10 
71 	Bobby Flores 	OT 	240 ........ 	11 
75 	Jason Bible 	OG 	155 	10 
77 	Terry Ware 	OT 	210 	9 
78 	Donnie Horton 	C 	200 	10 
82 	Will Ezzell TE 145 	9 
83 	Shannon Bailey 	 TE 160 	12 

Head Coach: Nathan Allen 	Asst. Coach: Doyle Browning 
Mascot: Wildcats 	School Colors: Blue & Gold 

Supt.: Dr. Don Bryan 	H.S. Principal: Robby Stuteville 
Elem. Principal: Weldon Hill 	Band Director: Tim Riley 

Cheerleader Sponsor: Anna Ezzell 

Family Food Store 

643-2221 

Jenkins Insurance 
Agency 
643-2251 

Jim Ratliff Welding 

643-6464 

White's Elite Cafe 
Open 5-8 Home Game Nights 

643-2417 

Friday, Sept. 15, 1989 will 
be a special day...a day 
when area golfers will put on 
their spikes in the fight 
against birth defects. The 
Abilene March of Dimes Golf 
Classic benefitting the Cen-
tral Texas Area March of 
Dimes will be held at the 
Maxwell Municipal Golf 
Course. The entry fee which 
includes lunch, green fees, 
carts, driving range, 
hospitality stations and 
awards is $50.00 per player. 
This amount is tax deducti-
ble. So get your team 
together because reserva-
tions are limited and must be 
made by September 8. For 
more information call the 
March of Dimes at 

Beyond 
the Books 

by Camille Harris 
The Senior Class held a 

rodeo this summer in hopes 
of raising enough money for 
their Senior trip. The effort 
fell short and the class then 
sold plastic ware for two 
weeks. Future plans are to 
win Homecoming float, win-
dow and sign contests. 

The Junior Class held 
three softball tournaments 
during the summer months. 
Despite one unhappy team 
from Ihownwood, all ended 
well. The Juniors have also 
put together a cookbook 
which should be out 
sometime before Christmas. 
- The Sophormores held a 
carwash last weekend and 
they would like to thank 
everyone who helped out and 
everyone who had dirty 
vehicles. 

Although the Freshmen, 
are in high school now they 
arc still adjusting to the 
shock, so they ae lucky to 
just find their way to school 
each morning. I am sure 
they will soon be on their 
feet. 

Druginvestigation 
Results In Arrest 

Pioneer 
Cooperative 

725-6564 

Farmers 

D&T 
Supplies 
643-4131 

Building 

Auto 
Main 

643-1701 

Street 
Repair 

Cooper's 

643-1805 

Texaco 

Dr. B.T. 

643-3141 

Carpenter 

& 
Buddy's 

643-7312 
Appliances 

Plumbing 

Funeral 
Higginbotham 

643-4321 
Home 

edly uses differen t names, was 
identified as a man wanted by 
federal authorities on two 
felony warrants. 

In order to spare Eastland 
County the expense of an 
expensive trial, Sheriff hogan 
planned to release the pris-
oner to federal authorities in 
Fort Worth for trial there in 
federal court. A federal judge 
has already ordered that he be 
held without bond. 

If the federal court fails to 
get a conviction, charges 
could then be filed in Eastland 
County. 

Local officers say that the 
F.B.I., which has more re-
sources than the local depart-
ment, should eventually ar-
rest other people involved in 
the illegal drug operation. 

The suspect was reportedly 
from the Lewisville and. 
Mesquite area. 

fare each person can be trans-
ported from home to one 
location and back. Rides are 
scheduled on a first come, 
first ride basis and must be 
made 24 hours in advance. At 
this time this service is avail- 

able in the city limits only. 
Another program provided 

by CTO is the Weatheriza-
tion Program. It provides 
weatherization assistance to 
eligible clients by caulking 
windows, weather stripping 
and etc. to stop air infiltration 
into homes. 

Other programs include the 
Energy Crises Intervention 
Program, Head Start Pro-
gram, Emergency Food As-
sistance Program, and the 
Emergency Homeless Pro-
gram. For further informa-
tion or assistance, contact 
Peggy Roberts, Eastland 
County Center Director, at 
(817) 629-3421. "PEOPLE 
HELPING PEOPLE" is 
CTO's motto, if you need 
assistance please do not hesi-
tate to call. 

Central Texas Opportuni-
ties, Inc. is a private, non-
profit organization that pro-
vides social services to the 
needy in the Central Texas 
area. Counties currently un-
der its sponsorship are: Cole-
man, Comanche, Brown, 
Runnels, Callahan, Stephens, 
McCulloch and Eastland. The 
main office is located in Cole-
man. Each County has one or 
more Multi-Purpose Centers 
and Head Start Centers, with 
Eastland County Head Start 
center located in Cisco and 
the Multi-Purpose Center 
located in Eastland. 

Each County has a Center 
Director who is available to 
assist anyone in need. Some 
of the services provided by 
the Centers include assistance 
in application preparation of 
forms for: AFDC, Food 
Stamps, Weatherization, 
medical claims and energy 
assistance; information and 
referrals to other helping 
agencies; commodity distri-
bution; food pantry; clothing 
room and other programs 
listed below. 

The Medical Transporta-
tion Program provides trans-
portation for Medicaid recipi-
ents to and from doctors, 
dentists, hospitals, clinics, or 
the pharmacy. In conjunction 
with the Medical Transporta-
tion Program, CTO is now 
offering public transportation. 
Locally these services include 
trips for social, recreational, 
educational, shopping and 
other various needs of the 
general public. For a small 

L&J CONSTRUCTION 

New Const. • Remodels 
Add-Ons • Steel Bldgs. 

Sheet Rock • Tape & Bed 
Accoustic • Texture 

Jim Ratliff 
	

Lynn Hutton 
817-643-6464 
	

817-725-7582 
Rising Star 
	Cross Plains 

Gift & 
Hubbard 

643-6242 
Gallery 

Palace 

643-3231 

Drug Store 

Buttons 

643-5705 

& Bows 

Chamber 
Rising 

of 
643-5754 

Star 
Commerce 

Nursing 
Rising Star 

643-2681 
Center 

Carey's 

643-7009 

Automotive 

TRANSPORTATION 
PROGRAM 

Operated by Central Texas 
Opportunities and Funded by 
The Texas Department of 
Highways and Public Trans-
portation. 

Schedule for Eastland 
County 

Monday 8:00 to 12:00 and 
1:00 to 5:00 

Tuesday - same hours. 
FEES (One-Way) 

Children under 3 ride free 
with an adult. 

Children 3 to 11 years - .35 
Ages 12 to 18 - .50 
Adults - .50 
Children 7 and under must 

be accompanied by an adult. 
SPECIAL REDUCED 

RATES FOR: 
1. Senior Citizens (60 and 

over) - .35 
2. Handicapped - .35 
3. No charge for Medical 

Transportation if passenger 
is on Medicaid. 

Please have exact change -
Drivers do not make change. 

By Richard Kurklin 
Some F_astland County citi-

zens were questioning why 
there were no arrests when • three drug labs were seized 
near Ranger earlier in the year. 
The answer was that the local 
people involved were already 
facing charges, for which they 
are yet to be tried, and the 
officers wanted to bring about 
the arrest and conviction of 
the "syndicate" people out-
side of Eastland County who 
were financing and setting up 
the labs. 

A man described as the 
"drug cook"or"the drug boss' 
second in command" was 
arrested near the motels and 
restaurants in Eastland by 
Sheriff's Dept. officers as a 
result of an ongoing investi-
gation. 

The armed man, who re-
ported had served time in a 
federal prison and had threat-
ened to shoot it out to keep 
from being arrested again, 
offered no resistance to be 
arrested by Sheriff Dee Hogan 
and several of his deputies, 
who were also armed with 
shotguns. 

A bag in the motel room 
rented by the suspect con-
tained illegal drug parapher-
nalia, papers belonging to the 
suspect, and what was be-
lieved to be illegal drugs, 
according to deputies. 

The suspect, who report- 

Winfrey 
& 

643-6251 
Peanut 

Feed 

Medley Motor 

643-6211  

Co. 

The 

643-4141 

Rising Star 

Max's 

643-1490 

Quickway 

First 
Member 

State 

643-2811 
FDIC 

Bank 

725-7582 

L & J Construction 

643-6464 

Chambers 

643-5292 

Grocery 

Nall's 

643-1441 

Quik Stop 

Butler 

643-3261 

Texaco 



Bazaar 
Plans 
Made 

The annual fall Eastland 
County Senior Citizen's 
Bazaar is right around the 
corner, states Janet Thomas, 
County Extension Agent-
Home Economics. 

Thomas states, that the 
Bazaar has traditionally been 
in November. However, the 
idea is being explored to host 
the County Senior Citizens 
Bazaar on October 6 and 7, at 
the vacant Perry Building on 
the Eastland square. Chang-
ing the Bazaar to the first 
weekend in October would 
allow the Bazaar to be held in 
conjunction with the Old Rip 
Festival and big parade. This 
date change would insure 
good crowds and high visi-
bility for our Senior Citizen 
Bazaar. 

Seniors arc you favorable 
to this date and location 
change? Let me hear from 
you! Call the Extension Serv-
ice office at 629-2222 and let 
your wishes be counted. A 
FINAL DECISION WILL 
BE MADE ON WEDNES-
DAY, SEPTEMBER 6,statcs 
Mrs. Thomas. 

College Notes 
Kevin Boscarnp received a 

Bachelor of Business Ad- 
ministration 	degree, 
specializing in management, 
from Sam Houston State 
University at Huntsville 
after the second summer 
semester. 

The university, located in 
a region of lakes, forests and 
hills, enrolls 12,000 students 
and. has a faculty of 400. 

ASCS News 
Highly erodible cropland 

that was planted to an an-
nual crop in prior years is 
exempt from the CONSER-
VATION COMPLIANCE 
provisions. This exemption 
expires on Jan. 1, 1990. It is 
the producer's responsibility 
to make sure that all land he 
operates that has highly 
erodible cropland has a con-
servation plan developed 
prior to Jan. 1, 1990. Failure 
to follow these provisions 
will cause the farm on which 
the plan is not obtained and 
all other farms in which the 
producer has an interest to 
be ineligible for any USDA 
benefits. 

Provisions of the 1990 
WHEAT PROGRAM in-
clude: target price of $4.00 
per bushel; weighted na-
tional loan rate before reduc-
tion of $2.44 and $1.95 after 
reduction; 5% acreage 
reduction requirement and 
an ACE requirement of 
5.26% of the planted and CU 
payment acreage; The 0/92 
provisions will apply; No 
paid land diversion; Signup 
will begin Jan. 16, 1990. 

This office will be CLOS-
ED Mon. Sept. 4, 1989 in 
observance of LABOR DAY. 

Transferring Farm: A 
FALL PEANUT QUOTA 
TRANSFER can be approv-
ed only if the transferring 
farm planted a sufficient 
quota on the farm. 

Receiving Farm: The 
amount of quota pounds that 
can be received is limited to 
the estimated ungraded 
pounds yet to be marketed 
plus the graded Seg. 1 
peanuts less the quota 
balance on the marketing 
card for the receiving farm. 
A fall transfer to cover 
peanuts that grade Seg. 2 or 
3 may never be made after 
the peanuts are graded. 

County Office Listing: We 
are maintaining a list for 
producers to indicate their 
need to transfer quota or 
receive quota under the fall 
transfer provisions. 

of ( SC 

Anti. to 	sv 
A BREAK 

Adequate lighting 
makes sense for... 
reading, working 
and studying. 

Use the correct lighting for 
all your tasks by remembering 
these lighting tips. 

When possible, move your light source around until 
you eliminate any shadows or glare to make it easier 
on your eyes. 

❑ Look for a light source with soft, even illumination so 
the brightness is balanced down, out, and up. 

I: When buying bulbs, remember that the lumen rating 
tells you the light output of the bulb. The watts are how 
much electricity is needed to produce the light output, 
And bulb life is the estimated number of hours the bulb 
will burn. 

Remember IEEE ib  IDY Supplies the energy—

but only YOU can use it wisely! 

JOIN 4-H! All youth, 3rd grade to 19 years of age, are invited to join 4-H Clubs 
during the month of September. 
LEARNING THE ART OF CLOWNING are (left to right): Ellisa Lewis, 
Cisco Kountry Kids 4-H Club; Laura Stacy, of Eastland Jr. 4-H Club; Andy 
Hallum, of Carbon 4-H; Kalli Arther, of Eastland Jr. 4-H Club; and Telitha 
Winge, of Nimrod 4-H Club. 
4-H IS FUN and EDUCATIONAL. Projects include all areas of agriculture, 
home economics, leadership, recreation, public speaking, dog care and 
training, computers,' and much more. 
For more information on joining 4-H, contact the local Eastland County office 
of the Texas Agricultural Extension Service states Janet Thomas, County 
Extension Agent. The office telephone numbers are 629-2222 or 629-1093. 

Crystal Wilbanks Leaves Eastland 

Eastland County 4-Hers say "We'll Miss You and 
Good Luck in Van Horn to Crystal Wilbanks", 
County Extension Agent - Agriculture. Crystal is 
transferring to Culberson County-District 6 (Van 
Horn) as County Extension Agent - Agriculture 
beginning September 1. 

Crystal began work in Eastland County on March 
1, 1986. She has provided outstadning leadership to 
the Eastland County 4-H Clubs. 

The Rainbow Cafe 
Open For Sunday Lunches 
Beginning This Sunday, Aug. 27 

Hours 11:00 a.m. - 2 p.m. 
39 
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North 
NEW 
Monday
8:00 a.m.-6:00 

Main 
STORE 

-Sunday 

FAMILY 
St. 

p.m. 

HOURS 

We 

FOOD 
Affiliated 
Phone 643-2221 

Food Store 

Wed., Sept. 6-Sat., 

STORE 
Rising 

PricesEffective 

Sept. 

Star 

9 

Support 

Make Deliveries ' 

Your Town - Shop At Home 

We Gladly Accept Food Stamps 

Cut 
Freshlike 

Green 
Beans 

2/880 ,4zglf 

Freshlike 
Whole Kernel 

Corn 
12 Oz. 

2/880 

Freshlike  
Spinach 

13 Oz. 

2/88¢ -11ke its i:-. 

Crisco 
48 

Veg. 

$1.99 

Oil 
Oz. 

Or Corn 
T / 

l'-7'. 

Blackeyes 
Trappey 

490 
w/Jal.  

..,ce. 	Coffee 90,o,, 
c 

Regular, 

Maryland 

$1.89 

Club 

13 Oz. 
Drip, Perk Or 
Filter 

Duncan 

Cake 
18.2 to 

Assorted 

88¢ 

18.3 

Hines 

Mix 
Oz. 

Duncan 

RTS 
102  Oz. 

$1.19 

Frosting 
Assorted 

Hines 

1 
Drinking 

Shurfine 

Water 

480 

Gal. 
Or Distilled 

- 

Paper 
Brawny 

Jumbo 
Assorted 

69e 

Towels 
Roll 4 

Toilet 
Northern 

Roll 

$1.19 

Tissue 
Pkg. 

Napkins 
Northern 

140 

89 
Ct. t. . — 

1 

Bran 
Natural 

16 

$1.99 

Post 

Oz. 
Flakes 

Apple 
Or 

Lucky 

64 

$1.79 
Oz. 

Cider 

Leaf 

Juice 
Reynolds 
Regular 

Foil 
25' 

59¢ 

Shurfresh 

Ice Cream 
1 Gal. 

Neopolitan 
Van., Choc., Strawberry 

$2.99 

Buttermilk, 
Or 

Biscuits 

4/890 

Pillsbury 

7.5 Oz. 

Tender Layer 
Country 

Silver 

Sliced 
QQ 88e Ammo  , 

Spur 

Bacon 
Lb. 

Chuck 
U.S.D.A. 

$1.39 
Boneless 

Choice 

Roast 

Lb. 

U.S.D.A. 

$1.49 

Chuck 
Steak 
Boneless 

Choice 

Lb. 

U.S.D.A. 

Shoulder 

$1.59 

Roast 
Boneless 

Choice 

Lb. 

Lean 

Chuck 

$2.79 

Steak 
Boneless 

& Tender 

Lb. 

Cube
Lean 

Beef 

$1.99 

Stew 
Boneless 

& Tender 

Meat 

Lb. $1.59 

Ground 
Chuck 

Fresh 

Lb. 

U.S.D.A. 

$1.69 

Shoulder 
Steak 
Boneless 

Choice 

Lb. 

New 
Red 

. 
''. 

Apples 
39¢ 

Crop 
Del. 

Lb. 

uir-Tomatoes  
- .,Nakcj¢ 

Large 
Red Ripe 

Lb. 

190 
Cabba 

Green 
ge 

Lb. 

Purple 

Turnips 
490 

Top 

Lb. 
490 

Potatoes 
Sweet 

#1 

Lb. 
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