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"Adopt A Grandparent" 
Program Will Begin 

Perry Tom (Pat) Valliant, Former 
Rising Star Resident, Retires 
From Ruidoso School System 

Thanks 
Some streets are be-

ing helped thanks to 
L.T. Owens for loading 
our City truck at Polly 
Price's caliche hill. 
Polly donated the sum 
of eight or ten loads. 

When I left the office 
Friday evening about 
5:30 p.m. there was 
Doug Owens on the 
road grader spreading 
the caliche on 
Brewster Street. 

Another thanks to 
Duby Jones for riding 
the grader with Doug 
showing him how to 
work all the levers. We 
are especially proud of 
Doug Owens his new 
position with the City 
as Utility and Gas 
Superintendent. 

Now personally let 
me tell you how proud I 
am of our employees. 
So that you may know, 
they are: Gary Wester-
man, over the Waste 
Water Department; 
Tom Bailey, in charge 
of Water Production; 
Coy Rankin, our Meter 
Man; Bea Kruger, our 
accountant, but we 
have put the title of 
Budget Administrator; 
and last but certainly 
not least is Helen Mit- 
chell 	as 	City 
Secretary. 

I'm so proud to work 
with these great people 
and you, too. 

Doris R. Griffin 
Mayor 

Don't forget tonight, 
Thursday 28th, at City 
Hall, there will be a 
meeting to hear your 

Physicals for May 
Jr. High and High 
School boys will be 
Monday, August 1, at 
8:00 p.m. Meet at the 

MEETING NOTICES 
4th MONDAY, 
Soc. Sec. Rep. 10:00 

As you know the 
days are long, hot, and 
dry. This brings on the 
use of extra water and 
your Water Depart-
ment is happy that we 
have enough water to 
supply your usage thus 
far. 

The City is having 
problems with a 
number of pumps. This 

The City Council of 
the City of Rising Star 
will conduct a public 
hearing at 7:30 p.m., 
July 28, 1983, at City 
Hall for the purpose of 
soliciting citizens' in-
put for the develop-
ment of a Community 
Development Program 

Just to let you know 
what is going on. Last 
Thursday about 10:30 
a.m. a supply line for 
the water just split 
right into. Needless to 
say, we didn't have the 
type or size of PVC we 
needed. 

We 	called 
Brownwood and they 
had it at the door ready 
for Coy Rankin to rush 
back with and get it in-
stalled. 

input for GRANT re-
quest. 

See you tonight at 
7:30 p.m. 

football field at 7:00 
and a bus will be taken 
to the Rising Star 
Clinic. Cost of physical 
is $7.00. 

slows our water pro-
duction; therefore, we 
urge you to be careful 
in the use of water. 

It looks like a long 
hot dry summer. 

We appreciate your 
cooperation. 

Doris R. Griffin 
Mayor 

Application to be sub-
mitted to the Texas 
Department of Corn-
munilty Affairs. 

All citizens, par-
ticularly low income 
residents, are invited 
and encouraged to at-
tend. 
Doris R. Griffin, 

Mayor 

The boys worked un-
til 7:30 p.m. getting 
this repair finished and 
the water turned back 
on. 

Your Utility Depart-
ment apologizes for not 
letting you know the 
water would be off, but 
that pipe that was 
about five feet under 
ground did not tell us 
what it was going to do. 

Doris R. Griffin 
Mayor 

WORD of GOD 

Prophecy 
[Old Testament) 

Therefore the Lord 
himself shall give 
you a sign; 
Behold, a virgin 

shall conceive, and 
bear a son, and 
shall call his name 
Immanuel. 

Isaiah 7:14 

Personal 

Recent visitors in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ed Witt were Mr. and 
Mrs. Pat Valliant of 
Ruidoso, New Mexico, 
Mrs. 	A .H . 
Frankenberg and 
Michi of Abilene, 
Angelyn Frankenberg 
of San Antonio, Mr. 
and Mrs. Hank 
Frankenberg and 
children of Austin and 
Donna and 011ie Hair 
of Brownwood. 

An adopt a grand-
parent program will 
begin activities in 
August at the Rising 
Star Nursing Center, 
announced 	Avis 
Massey, activity direc-
tor at the center. July 
31 at 2 p.m. is the date 
set for area children 
and interested adults 
to meet the residents 
and match adoptees 
and adopters, Mrs. 
Massey said. Most 
older people love to in- 

A first annual pool-
side fashion show will 
be presented at the 
Lakewood Recreation 
Center on Monday, 
Aug. 1, starting at 8 
p.m. 

The special event is 
sponsored by the local 
Alpha Rho Zeta 
chapter of Beta Sigma 
Phi. Fall and winter 
fashions from Higgin-
bothams, Etcetra, and 
Johsons's Dry Goods of 
Cross Plains; Trails 
West of Rising Star, 
the Gazebo of Cisco, 
and Utah Tailoring by 
Yvonne Peevy, will be 
modeled by sorority 

The young people 
from Junior High age 
up from First Baptist 
Church will go to 
Brownwood Lake for a 
cookout Saturday. 

Pre-school testing 
for kindergarten 
children has been 
scheduled for Wednes-
day, August 10, from 9 
a.m. to 2:30, in the 
kindergarten room at 
the Rising Star 
elementary school, an-
nounced Mrs. Robbie 
Rutherford, 
kindergarten teacher.  

teract wan children 
and a relationship with 
a grandparent can be 
immensely beneficial 
to children. 

Among plans that 
have been made is a 
special party on 
Grandparents Day in 
September and all 
those who participate 
in the "Adopt a Grand-
parent" program will 
be invited, Mrs. 
Massey added. 

members and other 
community ladies. 

A lovely Hawaiian 
theme will be carried 
out with decorations, 
music, entertainment 
and refreshments. 
Fresh flowers are be-
ing flown in from 
Hawaii, and a former 
Miss Hawaii will enter-
tain with authentic 
dancing. 

Advance tickets are 
now available for $5 
and can be obtained 
from Trails West. 

Due to the pool-side 
setting, no small 
children, please. 

They will leave the 
church at 10:00 a.m. 
Youth Director, Phillip 
Hudson, invites other 
youth to join them for 
fellowship and fun. 

All children who will 
be in kindergarten 
when school begins are 
to be at the school that 
day for the pre-school 
screening conducted 
by the Comanche 
County Co-op. This 
screening is done each 
year in preparation for 
the beginning of a new 
school year. 

Superintendent Pat 
Valliant is only slightly 
ambivalent about his 
retirement from the 
Ruidoso 	School 
District. 

I'm going to miss 
this school, having 
been here for 28 
years," he commented 
this week, "but I'm 
ready; I'm looking to 
retirement with joy." 

Valliant ended his 
long career in the 
Ruidoso Schools June 
30, when he relin-
quishes his position to 
associate superinten-
dent Sid Miller. The 
retiring superinten-
dent's career here has 
spanned 28 years, in-
cluding seven years as 
junior high school prin-
cipal, seven years as 
high school principal 
and 14 years as 
superintendent. 

"Sometimes the life 
of a superintendent is 
pretty short," he 
observed, indicating 
he feels fortunate to 
have been an exception 
to that rule. Valliant 
said he hoped when he 
came to the Ruidoso 
District in 1955 that "I 
would stay a long 
time." 

He had taught for 
one year in Rising 
Star, Texas and two 
years in Hobbs before 
moving to Ruidoso as a 
principal, for fifth 
through eighth grades. 

In the course of 
Valliant's 28 years in 
the local school 
district, he has 
witnessed a jump in 
salary levels for 
teachers, from an 
average of $3,690 a 
year to the present 
average of $24,466, and 
a jump in enrollment 
from about 550 
students to the 1,600 
anticipated for next 
year. 

The veteran school 
administrator said he 
expected that type of 
growth to occur, 
however, because 
"this was a place 
where everybody like 
to come." 

Raising salary levels 
for teachers and non-
certified personnel 

Mrs. Rutherford will 
contact the parents of 
children who were pre-
registered in the spr-
ing to set up an ap-
pointment. Parents of 
children who were not 
pre-registered should 
make an appointment 
by calling the 
kindergarten teacher 
at 643-1550.  

was one of Valliant's 
top priorities when he 
took 	over 	the 
superintendent's job. 

"I felt like if we were 
going to have a good 
school system, salaries 
were going to have to 
be not only competitive 
but way above the 
competitive mark," he 
related. 

Teacher salaries in 
Ruidoso now rank se-
cond among the 89 New 
Mexico 	school 
districts, having risen 
from a place "near the 
bottom," Valliant 
reported. Helping 
enable the schools to 
raise salary levels was 
an ever-increasing 
district property 
valuation, which grew 
from just under $8 
million in 1970, the 
year after Valliant 
became superinten-
dent, to over $65 
million this year. 

Valliant also is proud 
of the building projects 
initiated since he mov-
ed into the ad-
ministrative office. 

"We couldn't do any 
building for so long," 
he recalled. "We just 
had to build on 
everywhere we could-
put a 'lean to' here and 
a 'lean to' there." 

But in 1978 White 
Mountain Middle 
School was completed, 
under 	Valliant's 
leadership, and a new 
high school is now 
under construction. 
Valliant admits feeling 
he had a part in obtain-
ing Capital Outlay 
monies to make those 
projects possible. 

But for most ac-
complishments during 
his tenure, Valliant 
credits all school per-
sonnel, from the board 
of eduction to custo-
dians. 

"I hope that I have 
played a small part in 
the growth and things 
that have been ac-
complished," he  

remarked. "But when 
it gets right down to it 
you've got to get down 
to personnel." 

Valliant said he has 
no regrets about his 
years as superinten- 
dent, mentioning only 
spending more time 
"out in the classroom" 
as a goal of which he 
has fallen short. 

"I've tried to stay 
close to the person-
nel," he noted. "I think 
they know that I 
have." He said in-
creasing paperwork in 
the administration of-
fice had prevented his 
visiting each of the 
schools as often as he 
would have liked. The 
addition of an 
associate superinten-
dent to the staff will 
enable Valliants's suc-
cessors to remain 
closer to personnel, the 
retiring administrator 
believes. 

Valliant said his 
retirement plans in-
clude spending a lot of 
time at his farm in Ris-
ing Star, Texas, 
although 	"this 
(Ruidoso) will always 
be home." He intends 
to keep busy with 
carpentry work, 
traveling and fishing. 
But he promises not to 
lose touch with the 
Ruidoso Schools. 

"I've been telling Sid 
I'll be around next 
year to visit with him," 
related Valliant. 

He said he will 
remember the last 14 
years as superinten-
dent as being "a good 
job." 

And certainly Pat 
Valliant will long be 
remembered for his 
numerous contribu-
tions to the local educ-
tional system over the 
past 28 years. 

School board presi-
dent, Dave Parks, 
remarked at time the 
board accepted, with 
regret, Valliant's 
resignation "Very few 
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ftlean-Up Week, 
August 14 
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May High and Jr. High 
Boys Report for 
Physicals Aug. 1 
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4th TUESDAY 
Chamber-Commerce 

City Holds Public Hearing 

on Community Grants 

The Surprise Was 
On Us 

Sorority Sets Pool-Side 
Fashion Show August 1 

FBC youth Schedules 
Cookout 

Kindergarten Children Will 
Be Pre-Tested August 10 



Real Estate el 

REAL ESTATE FOR 
SALE? Let us handle it 
for you. 25 yrs. selling 
your area. We have the 
buyers. Cogburn Real-
ty, 893-6666, DeLeon 
nights 893-5898 or 
8934642. 
6-tfc 

502 E. Mill St. 4 Br., 2 bath, 
den, comb. kitchen and din-
ing, carpeted. Lot 80 X 180. 
New storage room. 
817-643-4071. 
21-tfc. 

I have a variety of homes 
and land listed. Let's talk. 

Louis A. Mayfield 
Broker 

817-6434073 

MIst 

LORING PEACHES $10 per 
bushel - you pick. One mile 
west and one mile south of 
Cottonwood, Dan Childress, 
817-725-6279. T-60 
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This Billboard 
For Rent 

4 issues a month in Rising Star for $12 

FOR SALE: 1977 Dodge 
Van; five captain chairs and 
couch, sink and ice box. Low 
mileage and loaded. Also 
1977 Courrier pickup with 
radio and air, loaded and low 
mileage. See at Scott's Paint 
and Body or call 629-2372 or 
1514. TF 

FmHA non-discrimination 
apartment for rent. Call 
817-842-5294. 
16-tfc 

WANTED 

OIL AND GAS leases 
wanted, send name, address, 
and legal description to R-V 
Petroleum Land Service, 
P.O. Box 2278, Abilene, 
Texas 79604. T-63 

WANTED: Wire welders 
and arc welders with ex-
perience for manufacturing 
corral panels and gates. Ap-
ply in person only. Evans 
Pipe and Gate Co., Rising 
Star. 57-3tp 

OPPORTUNITY 

r

Sand and Caliche 
Hauling 

Willie Ezzell 
Phone: 643-5431 

RUST & SONS 
FENCING 

CONTRACTOR 

Pipe Line and general 
fencing construction. 

Rt. 1, Box 120, Rising 
Star,Tex. 76471 

PH: 817-643-3137 

OLIVER WEST 
Pump and 

Water Well Service 
Valley Aermotor Pumps 
'13hp & larger stocked 
2'/2 mi. so. Rising Star 

817-643-4683 
Call Anytime 

Need things fixed up 
around the house? Need 
a new cabinet, kitchen 
or bathroom? Or 
wooden furniture made 
or repaired? Call Joe 
Campbell, Campbell's 
Cabinet 	Shop, 
817-842-5526. Rt. 5 Box 
107B, Comanche, Tx. 
76442. If no answer, call 
817-643-2251. 26-6mo. 

T BYRD REALTY 
1100 EARLY BLVD 

EARLY, TEX 
915-643-2193 or 643-2317 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNI-
TY! Large brick bldg. on 
main street of Rising Star. 
Can be purchased with 
business or property only. A 
good buy! #281 
THREE LOTS WITH 2 BR 2 
BATH HOME Nice shady 
corner lot! Has another 
house that can be bought and 
moved. Also has good water 
well! Bargain! #280 

ESTABLISHED BUSINESS 
Buy station & shop or owner 
will keep muffler shop tools 
and reduce price! Priced to 
sell! Let's talk! 

BARGAIN!! Good older 
home on Hwy 36 close to 
down town! Good location, 
bargain priced! #234 
27-4tc 

LAND & HOME 
You select property of your 
choice - manufactured home 
of your choice and we have 
the financing for total 
package. For more informa-
tion call or come by FOUR 
SEASON'S MFG. HOUSING 
1504 N. Plaza, Granbury 
817-573-2442. 
29-2tc 

Houses a, 
For Sale 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
Statement of Intent to Change Rates 

In accordance with Article Ill, 
Section 43 of the Public Utility 
Regulatory Act and Section 4, Rule 
052.01_00.043, paragraph (a), (2), (A) 
of the Rules of Practice and 
Procedure of the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas, Continental 
Telephone Company of Texas and 
Lakeside Telephone Company 
hereby notice their intent to change 
rates effective August 4, 1983. 

These rate changes are designed to 
increase gross intrastate revenues by 
approximately 12.4% per year. 

A complete copy of the new rate 
schedule is on file with the Public 
Utility Commission at Austin, Texas. 
The new rate schedule is also 
available for public inspection in 
each telephone company's service 
office location in Texas. 

CONTINENTAL TELEPHONE COMPANY OF TEXAS 
LAKESIDE TELEPHONE COMPANY 
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CI CO HADIAT 
SERVICE 

207 E. 6th St., Cisco 
(Breckenridge Hwy.) 
'leaning-rodding-
recoring-auto-truck- 
tractor 	radiators- 
heaters. New radiator'  
and heaters. Auto ga' 
tanks cleaned-repaired. 
Open Monday thru Fri 
da), 8 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. 

all 442-1547. risen, tic 

I PRODUCING oil and 
gas, Coleman County 

I "crosscut," 3 - 3300 ft., 1 
- 930 ft., all new equip-
ment. $180,000. Dial 
806-794-2015. 	p-58 

CARD 
(2!) THANKS   

There are no words 
that can express our 
love and appreciation 
for our friends and 
neighbors who helpd 
bear the passing of our 
loved one, W.L. 
Frizzell. 

We appreciate the 
flowers, food, calls, 
prayers and cards. 
And especially we 
thank Rev. Dick 
Williams and Higgin-
botham Funeral Home 
for all they did for us. 
The W.L. Frizzell 

Family 

Employer's Quarterly • 
Federal Tax Return 
Deadline Near 

Aug. 1 is the date by 
which employers must 
report on Form 941 
social security and 
withheld fedeal income 
taxes for the second 
quarter of 1983 and pay 
any taxes due, the In-
ternal Revenue Ser-
vice says. If the 
quarterly liability( 
less any deposit during 
the quarter) is $500 or 
more, the unpaid 
balance must be 
deposited. 

ly Federal Tax 
Return." 

Employers who have 
not received a Form 
941 by mail can order 
one through the 
Forms/Tax Informa-
tion number listed in 
the telephone book 
under U.S. Govern-
ment. IRS Publication 
15, 	Circular 
E-Employer's Tax 
Guide, is also available 
by telephone. 

This deadline does 
not apply to employers 
who make timely 
deposits of the full 
amount of tax due in 
Federal Reserve or ap-
proved commercial 
banks. They are allow-
ed until Aug. 10 to file 
Form 	941, 
"Employer' Quarter- 

If you have furniture in your 
home you would like to sell, 
or appliances, I am in-
terested. No Junk. Call after 
6:30 p.m. Ask for Jim. Ph. 
643-5126. 
30-1tc. 

FOR SALE: Sudan baled 
hay, $2.00 per bale 
Blackeyed peas, $5.00 bu. 
You pick em. Some 
watermelons. B.B. Ivie--
across street from Star 
Plaza, Rising Star. 
30-1tp. 

Need your Peanuts hoed? 
Call 734-2585. 
30-6tc. 

LOST & 
FOUND 

LOST: Red Irish Setter July 
21, 1/4  mi. South of Rising 
Star. REWARD. Ph. 
817-6434611 or 6434421. 
30-3tc. 

in 

RUBBER 
STAMPS 

at the 

RISING STA 
643-4141 

REPORT OIL FIELD THIEVES 
1.800-01L-COPS 

TOLL FREE • REWARD 

S 

et remiss)) ((WISHED ADS sure to   
SERVICE 

aggromisommaINNIIIL 

Fast, Dependable 
Him Developing 
Palace Drug Store 
Risino Star Texas 

D & E HOME 
IMPROVEMENT SALE 

$$Save Big $$ 
Siding & Remodeling 

Custom made storm 
windows 

Soffits & Fascias 
One call does all. 

817-643-3606 
WELDING 

Oilfield and Farm 
Jim Ratliff 
Ph:643-6464 

36-tfc 

SHAKLEE PRO-
DUCTS: Do you really 
get a balanced diet? Let 
me tell you about Dr. 
Shaklee's Slim and 
Trim Plan. 

We also carry natural 
food supplements, con- 
centrated 	bio- 
degradable household 
cleaners, natural skin 
care products, toiletries 
and baby products. 
Barbara Jo Kanady, 
Shaklee Distributor 
PH: 643-5791 BUDDY COOK 

Residential, Commer- 
cial 

Refrigeration & Plumb- 
ing 

817-842-5950 

Rising Star 

GROUP HEALTH 
INSURANCE 

THE TRAVELERS 
Eastland County Farm 

Bureau 
643-5951 	TC 

FREE Swap shop on KVMX-
FM 97 Radio - twice every 
Monday through Friday at 
7:10 a.m. and 12:30 noon -
Call 629-8585 and tell the 
Micro-Plex what you have to 
sell, rent, give away are to 
announce! It's a free com-
munity service of KVMX-
FM 97 Radio. '17 

RANGER 	FLEA 
MARKET 

Open 2nd & 4th weekend 
Dealers & garage sales 

welcome 
Spaces $5 without elec- 

tricity 
$8 with. 647-1992. TFC 

WATERLESS COOKWARE 
22 Piece Sets 

Life-Time Guarantee 
Competitors Prices: 

$1000 to $1400 
Our Price: 

$400 
Call: 817-629-8669 

Legal Notice 

Terms.  

FOR SALE: 114 acres in 
Palo Pinto County near San-
to and Palo Pinto Lake. 
Fronts on black top county 
road, city water, and R.E.A. 
line. Ideal for development. 
$1500 per acre. Call 
817-442-1303 after 6 p.m. 

7% 
...in 	ralreiss•••..ri ••••••••••0.04•••••••••••••••••rod"••••••••••• 

FOR SALE: 4 bdrm brick 
house, 2 story, 2 bath, dining 
rm., all electric, central heat 
& air. Large lot, water well, 
7 large pecan trees & con- 
crete 	cellar. 	Call 
915-8624386. 
42tfc 

	-it 

SCHOOLMASTER ANTIQUES 
634-2221 

We will buy one Item or an 
estate. Call fur appraisals, Items 
fur Mile or special items you 
wish to purchase. 	 TC 

beneficiaries anti par-
ticipants or the exer-
cise of any rights of 
such beneficiaries and 
participants in the con-
duct of the operations 
of this organization. 

"Any person who 
believes himself, or 
any specific class of in-
dividuals, to be sub-
jected by this 
organization 	to 
discrimination pro-
hibited by Title VI of 
the Act and the Rules 
and Regulations issued 
thereunder may, by 
himself or a represen-
tative, file with the 
Secretary 	of 
Agriculture, 
Washington, D.C. 
20250, or the Rural 
Electrification Ad-
ministration, 
Washington, D.C. 
20250, or this organiza-
tion, or all, a written 
complaint. Such com-
plaint must be filed not 
later than 180 days 
after the alleged 
discrimination, or by 
such later date to 
which the Secretary of 
Agricultural or the Ad-
ministration extends 
the time for filing. 
Identity of com-
plainants will be kept 
confidential except to 
the extent necessary to 
carry out the purpose 
of the Rules and 
Regulations." 

FOR SALE: 1.1 acres with 6 
large pecan trees. 3 bdr., 2 
bath with large storage bldg. 
817-643-3384. 

I

I

L 

WATER WELLS 
Ray Morworth 

Rotary Drilling 

Air R Mud 

Major Brand Pumps 

915/356-2844a  

STATEMENT OF 
NONDISCRIMINA-

TION 
"Comanche County 

Electric Cooperative, 
Inc., has filed with the 
Federal Government a 
Compliance Assurance 
in which it assures the 
Rural Electrification 
Administration and 
that it will comply fully 
with all requirements 
of Title VI of the Civil 
Rights Act of 1964 and 
the Rules and Regula-
tions of the Depart-
ment of Agriculture 
issued thereunder, to 
the end that no person 
in the United States 
shall, on the ground of 
race, color, or national 
origin, be excluded 
from participation in, 
be denied the benefits 
of, or be otherwise sub-
jected to discrimina-
tion in the conduct of 
its program and the 
operation of its 
facilities. Under this 
Assurance, 	this 
organization is com- 
mitted not to 
discriminate against 
any person on the 
ground of race, color 
or national origin in its 
policies and practices 
relating to applications 
for service or any 
other policies and 
practices relating to 
treatment 	of 

CARD 
OF THANKS 

I want to thank my 
many friends for their 
kind thoughtfulness 
during my illness. 
Your beautiful cards, 
flowers, food, gifts and 
especially 	your 
prayers comforted me 
and made me so 
thankful that I have so 
many true and caring 
friends. 

My special thanks 
goes 	to 	our 
"Ambulance Corps" 
for their faithful and 
efficient care while 
transporting me to the 
hospital. 

In times of such need 
it is a great comfort to 
know that we have an 
ambulance and such 
dedicated volunteers 
who give so freely of 
their time, expertise 
and energy in service 
to our community. 

Sincerely, 
Irene S. Mayfield 

New Campus Ridge Meal 
Replacement Diet Plan, in 
two delilcious flavors, com-
parable to Cambridge. Cam-
pus Ridge at PALACE 
DRUG 
27-10tp 

Own your own Jean-
Sportswear, Infant-Preteen, 
Ladies Apparel, Combina-
tion, accessories or Quality 
Childrens Furniture Store. 
National brands; Jordache, 
Chic, Lee, Levi; Vanderbilt, 
Izod, Gunne Sax, Calvin 
Klein, Esprit, Zena, Ocean 
Pacific, Brittania, Evan 
Picone, Healthtex, 300 
others. $7,900 to $24,500, in-
ventory, airfare, training, 
fixtures, grand opening etc. 
Mr. Loughlin (612) 888-6555. 
30-Up. 

FOR SALE: Brangus 
Bulls. 647-1182 or 
647-1155. TF 

For your metal 
building needs get a 

Second Opinion 
Rolston Metal 

Building Systems 
915-698-1721 

GOVERNMENT JOBS 
Thousands of vacancies 
must be filled immediately. 
$17,634 to $50,112. Call 
716-842-6000, Ext. 0948. 
28-1tp 
30-1tp 

FOR SALE: 1977 Ford LTD, 
power steering, air cond. 
Needs brake work. $900. We 
fix brakes $1000.00. Call after 
5:30 weekdays. Anytime 
weekends. 442-2757. 	TC 

CALL US FIRST 
for all auction needs: 
TUCKER AUCTION 

CO. 
Rt. 1 Box 90 

Eastland, TX 76448 
817-629-1956 

Consignment sale 2nd 
Sat, of each month 7:00 
p.m. TC 

Custom ag bagging. Call 
Stephenville Forage & Com-
modity, Inc., Stephenville, 
TX. Donnie Bramlett or Dale 
Allen. 817-968-6590. 
25-6tc 

YOU WON'T NEED A 
PUSH with a Continen-
tal Battery in your car 
this winter. Free bat-
tery check and free in-
stallation. 
CENTRAL AUTO 

PARTS 
801 East Central 

COMANCHE, TEX. 
76442 

Ph: 915-356-3925 
OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK 

BE A WINNER. I'm 
looking 	for 	top 
achievers who want big 
commissions and rapid 
management growth for 
part time effort. Oppor-
tunity is knocking to 
earn while you learn. A 
little hard work pays off 
in a big way. Call Penny 
442-1707. 

For Sale 3,000 sq. bales hay 
grazer & volunteer oats. 
$2.50 bale in the field. Call 
643-3052 after 8:00 p.m. 
25-tfc 

	0 

Custom hay baling, round or 
square. Call Mike Hardwick 
259-2618 or George Plummer 
259-3663. 
26-5tp. 

HAY BAILING 
Square or Lg. round 

T.J. Parrish 
442-3674. p-57tfc 

delve 
ICI 

LIMITED - LIMITED 
3 BEDROOM 2 bath, 
wood siding, Ben-
chmark steel front door, 
extra insulation, storm 
windows, white acrylic 
latex on roof, upgrade 
furniture, 
washer/dryer, air con-
ditioning, underpinning 
material, and more. 
Delivered, set-up, & 
tied-
down."115,950.00••• 
Only limited number 
available 	FOUR 
SEASON'S MFG. 
HOUSING. 1504 N. 
Plaza, 	Granbury 
817-573-2442 
29-2tc 

SWIMMING I.FASONS 
Lakewood 643-7792 
or Kathy 725-7640 
July 26 to Aug. 6 

FOR SALE 3-yr-old 
Limousin bull. We have the 
papers. 259-3951. 
29-tfc 

FOR SALE: Skid mounted 4 
cyld. Jeep engine with 2 inch 
roper pump. $750.00. Also 4 -
2 inch roper pumps. Call 
Olden 653-2405. T-61 

FOR SALE 34" riding lawn 
mower, electric start. Call 
643-3212 or see it at last house 
on E. Mill St. 
29-2tp 



Stephanie Long High Point Winner Junior 
Division Tailored day wear. 

Jennifer Linney High Point Winner Junior 
Division Non-tailored day wear. 

Wendy Green High Point Winner Sub-junior 
Division. 

the senior division at 
the district show will 
progress to the Texas 
4-H Fashion Show 
September 14-16 in San 
Antonio. 

  

  

(Pat) Valliant 
(Continued from page one) 

people have equaled 
the contribution to this 
school system" made 
by Pat Valliant. 
"Nobody has ever done 
more than he has for 
the system." 

Ruidoso is the only 
system in the state to 
have all its public 
schools accredited 
with commendation by 
the State Department 
of Education. 

Sid Miller, assistant 
superintendent stated 
that "My opinion that 
Mr. Valliant was the 
`allowing force' to br-
ing us from a good 
school district to an ex- 
cellent 	school 
district." 

Miller 	cited 
Valliant's encourage-
ment of innovation; his 

• excellent working rela-
tionship with prin-
cipals, teachers and 
the school board; and 
his active participation 
in the building of a 
good curriculum for 
Ruidoso schools. 

A scholarship fund 
has been established 

MEMBERS PRE-
SENT: Jack Hubbard, 
David Harris, Dan 
Hughes, Sue Barnes, 
Terry Geye 
MEMBERS ABSENT: 
Joyce Baker, Joe Mc-
Collum 
SCHOOL PERSON-
NEL PRESENT: Gene 
Williams, Frank Gray, 
Weldon Hill 
BUSINESS: Call to 
order by President, 
Jack Hubbard. 
1. MINUTES of the 

regular meeting June 
13, 1983 and special 
meeting June 30, 1983 
were read and approv-
ed by general consent 
of the board. Motion 
carried. 

2.COMMUNICATION- 

S: 	3.REGULAH 
BUSINESS: 

(a) Motion by Sue 
Barnes second by Dan 
Hughes that the bills 
incurred by the Rising 
Star I.S.D. be ordered 
paid. Motion carried. 

w
(b) Terry Geye mov-

ed and Jack Hubbard 
seconded the motion to 
set a budget workshop 
special meeting July 
25, 1983 at 8 o'clock 
p.m. Motion carried 
unanimously. 

for Valliant. The Pat 
Valliant Scholarship 
fund was begun by the 
Ruidoso Education 
Association. The first 
scholarship will be 
awarded to a member 
of the 1983 graduating 
class, and it will be a 
continuing scholar-
ship. 

"It (the scholarship) 
carries through on 
Pat's belief that 
everything involved 
with school is to help 
the student," White 
Mountain Elementary 
School principal Mike 
Gladden explained. 
"The scholarship will 
be characteristic of his 
career objectives." 

The National Honor 
Society in the high 
school was named for 
Valliant a few years 
ago. 

Perry Tom (Pat) 
Valliant is a native of 
Rising Star. He is the 
son of the late Mr. and 
Mrs. P.N. Valliant and 
brother of Mrs. Clif-
fogene Witt of Rising 
Star and Mrs. 
Estellene 
Frankenberg 	of 
Abilene. 

(c) Upon a motion by 
Jack Hubbard and se-
cond by Dan Hughes 
the Board unanimous-
ly agreed to hire Patsy 
Rios as lunchroom 
manager and Nancy 
Bailey as lunchroom 
worker. 
4.OLD BUSINESS: 

(a) Motion by David 
Harris second by Sue 
Barnes to appoint 
Rowena Chambers to 
re-invest the principal 
($13,773.00) in the 
"Skeet" Clark Endow-
ment Fund at the best 
interest rate available. 
Motion carried. 

(b) Motion by Jack 
Hubbard second by 
Terry Geye to not ac-
cept the Maintenance 
agreement presented 

By Gary Slade 
Staff Writer 

KOKOMO-"Rainfall in the 
next 40-60 days will deter-
mine what kind of crop the 
peanut farmers will have in 
Eastland County." said 
DeMarquis Gordon, County 
Extension Agent. 

That statement may be 
very true as much of the soil 
around the peanut crops has 
started to dry up from the 
lack of rainfall this summer. 

Last year (1982) was a 
wetter year during the three 
summer months then what 
this summer has shown so 
far. 

In June of 1982 6.54 inches 
of rain fell on Eastland Coun-
ty crops, June of 1983 had 
under half that amount with 
3.07 inches of rain. 

July was a dry month in 
1982 with less than one full 
inch (.91) of rain falling. Ju-
ly 1983 has been a worst 
disaster so far with only .04 
of an inch of rain falling. 

August 1982 recorded .44 of 
an inch, August 1983 does not 

by 	Continental 
Telephone Co. Motion 
carried. 
5. NEW AND MISC. 
BUSINESS: 

(a) Upon a motion by 
David Harris and se-
cond by Sue Barnes the 
board unanimously ac-
cepted the low bid of 
ten thousand and seven 
hundred ($10,700.00) 
dollars from Southern 
Bleachers for 10 rows 
high and 93 feet long 
stadium bleachers. 

(b) Motion by Sue 
Barnes second by 
David Harris to set Ju-
ly 25, 1983 as atten-
dance Policy first 
reading and August 8, 
1983 for the second 
reading. Motion car-
ried. 

look promising. 
So what happens if the 

farmers do not get the 
necessary rain? The county 
economy could stand to lose 
up to 10 million dollars in lost 

revenue. 	One county of- 
ficial estimated that a good 

peanut crop in Eastland 
County is worth about $10 
million dollars to the county. 

That money is what 
farmers use to buy new cars, 
trucks, equipment and 
general goods with in the 
county. If no rain falls, so 
does the spending in the 
county. 

Not all hope is lost since 
many farmers have put in 
automatic 	irrigation 
systems for backup in dry 
weather. 

One such farmer is Albert 
Hendricks, of Kokomo. 
Although he planted his crop 
late because of the late cold 
spells he said he plans to 
start irrigating the week of 
July 25 if he doesn't get any 
rain. 

His peanut vines are up, a 
nice green color, and are 
starting to bloom. That 

6. REPORTS OF AC- 
COUNTS 	BY 
SUPERINTENDENT: 
7. REPORTS OF IN-
STRUCTIONAL PRO- 
GRESS 	BY 
SUPERINTENDENT 
AND PRINCIPALS: 
8. REPORT OF 
SPECIAL COMMIT-
TEES: 
9. READING OF 
MEETING'S 
MINUTES 	BY 
SECRETARY, David 
Harris. 
10. MEETING AD-
JOURNED BY 
General Consent of the 
board. 

tJ 

bloom is when the moisture 
is needed. 

After the bloom is 
pollinated a peg is formed 
and grows into the ground. 
That peg must grow into the 
ground and not on top of it or 
it will die. Once the peg is in 
the ground, water is needed 
to help the peg form a pod 
from which the peanut 
emerges. 

That time frame is when 
rain is needed the most. But 

even if rain falls on the vines 
there is always another pro-
blem and that is disease. 

Most common is Eastland 
County is Leafspot. This 
disease occurs when there is 
moisture on the leaves and 
the weather is warm either, 
from rain or irrigation. It 
forms a black dot on the leaf 
of the vine and then turns the 
leaf or leaves yellow causing 
them to fall off and killing 
the vine. 

Fungicides are used to 
help control the disease 
either after the needed rain 
or during irrigation if rain 
does not fall. Benlate 2 and 
Bravo are the two most com-
mon used fungicides being 
used in Eastland County. 

The Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service reminds 
farmers that peanut 
diseases can be controlled by 
using the proper combina-
tion of cultural and chemical 
methods. Growers are en-
couraged to accurately 
diagnose the disease pro-
blems occuring on their 
farm and utilize those prac-
tices needed to get positive 
economic returns. 

As far as the present 
status of the peanuts Gordan 
said, "In general the crops 
are in real good condition. 
Most were late planted due 
to the prolonged cold soil 
temperature, but the stands 
are real good and we're not 
seeing any major diseases." 

Gordan went on to say, 

Marsha Crenwelge, 
LaTonya Caraway, 
Wendy 	Green, 
Stephanie Long, Jen-
nifer Linney and Sue 
Osborne were named 
winners of the 
Eastland County 4-H 
Fashion Show July 14 
at the Siebert Elemen-
tary School in 
Eastland. Christy Fu-
qua, County Extension 
Agent, presented 
trophies to the high 
point winners of each 
class and blue and red 
ribbons to each girl 
based on judges' 
scores. The awards 
were donated by the 
Eastland County 4-H 
Adult Leaders Associa-
tion. Jami Long, presi-
dent of 4-H Council, 
and Leanne Brown, 
4-H Junior Leader, 
commentated for the 
fashion show using the 
theme "Sidewalk 
Silhouettes." Lois 
Crenwelge, chairman 
of the 4-H Fashion 
Show Committee, 
presented the girls 
with denim tote bags 
which were made by 
the Eastland 4-H 
mothers. During the 
days judging and prac-
tice refreshments were 
provided by the 
Eastland County Ex-
tension Homemakers 
Council and Lois 
Crenwelge. 

In the pre-4-H divi-
sion the winner was 
Marsha Crenwelge in 
the non-tailored day 

"We are entering that im-
portant water stage where 
our requirement for water 
will go up every day. Those 
that can irrigate will be do-
ing that but those that are on 
dry-land will be needing 
some moisture by August 1." 

Irrigation in the county 
has been designed to be a 
supplemental water form, 
but once the water supplies 
get low then those farmers 
will also be in need of rain. 

"At the stage we are in 
right now our crops could go 
either way. At this point it 
looks good, very good but on-
ly the next 40-60 days will tell 
for sure." Gordan said. 

So for now, all Eastland 
County farmers can do is 
keep looking in the sky and 
hoping that sometime soon 
that much needed rain will 
come before the Texas heat 
and wind has taken its toll. 

4-H Leaders 
and Parents 
To Meet 

The Rising Star 4-H 
Club Adult leaders will 
meet Thursday, July 
28 from 7 to 8 p.m. in 
the First State Bank 
Community Room. 

The purpose of this 
meeting is planning 
the Eastland County 
Awards Banquet to be 
hosted by the Rising 
Star 4-H Club Oct. 8. 

If you have a child in 
4-H and are interested 
in helping with the ban-
quet please come and 
bring your ideas. A 
word of caution, those 
who do not show up, 
get nominated for the 
tackiest jobs! 

wear division. In the 
sub-junior division the 
winners are LaTonya 
Caraway—non-tailored 
day wear, and Wendy 
Green-active sport-
swear. In the junior 
division the winners 
are, Stephanie Long-
tailored day wear, and 
Jennifer Linney-non-
tailored day wear. The 
senior division winner 
is Sue Osborne in the 
non-tailored day wear 
category. Other 4-H 
members included 
Albany Sargent, 
Meredith Hamblen, 
Kimberly Wilson, Kori 
Lewis and Karmen 
Hull in the sub-junior —
non-tailored day wear 
category, and Stacey 
Slampa in the senior 
non-tailored day wear 
division. 

LaTonya, Wendy, 
Stephanie, Jennifer 
and Sue will represent 
Eastland County at the 
District 8 Fashion 
Show to be held in the 
Clyde Wells Fine Arts 
Building at Tarleton 
State University in 
Stephenville on July 
26. 

The four winners of 

Rain Becomes Crucial To 
1983 County Peanut Crops 
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Rising Star Independent School 
Board Holds Meeting 
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Small Drink With Purchase of 
Regular Hamburger 	- 

OR 

EE r 

Medium Drink With Purchase of 
L 
	

Doublemeat Cheeseburger 
tI Min  •  Star Snak Steak 

TRAILER SALES 
Complete line of Reasonably 
Priced new stock and horse 
trailers. Buy and sell Used 
Trailers. Repairs & Painting 

BARKEIVS GARAGE ' 
May, Texas 259-2252 



GINGER ENDSLEY 
Record Research 

Top 10 U.S. Oil Producing States, 1982' 

Thousand 
Barrels 
Per Day 

% of 
Total 

Production 

1. Texas 	  2,536 29.3 

2. Alaska 	  1,698 19.6 

3 Louisiana 	  1,252 14.5 

4 California 	  1,095 12.7 

5 Oklahoma 	  435 5.0 

6. Wyoming 	  333 3.8 

7 Kansas 	  195 2.3 

8. New Mexico 	  194 2.2 

9 North Dakota 	  126 1.5 

10 Mississippi 	  95 1 	1 

TOTAL, Top 10 	  7,959 92.0 

TOTAL. U.S 	  8,655 100.0 

'Preliminary data. Includes crude oil and lease condensale 

Source -0// & Gas Journal." Jan 31. 1983 

Completions 

Roustabout Crews 
Workovers 

Rods 8 Tubing 

ACE WELL SERVICE INC. 
—Dole Jones— 

Swabbing 

Th.;" 

Fully Insured For Customers Protection 

Radio Equipped 	 Call Day Or Night 

TC 	200 S N ir•nori 559-5439 

r 

Many Good And Sincere Individuals 

...give little thought to the question of values when we 
should measure them in terms of personal worth in 
everything he buys, enjoys or does. For example, some 
folks will buy real estate without any kind of evidence of 
title disregarding the fact that the principal value of the 
purchase is in the title, not in the land itself or the im- 
provements thereon This kind of thinking costs property 
owners thousands of dollars annually which could be sav- 
ed and a part of the savings wisely spent for an abstract 
of title or title insurance. 

Eastland County Abstract Company 
Pat and Anelle Miller 	629-1077 

TC 

The Oil Belt News 
THURSDAY, JULY 28, 1983 

Classified Ads 
Get Results Sun Ranks High 

In Sales & Income Oil Instruments 
EASTLAND 
DRILLING 

INC. 
817/629.8512 

24 Hour Number 

Sun Exploration and Production Company engages in 
worldwide (except Canada) exploration for and develop-
ment, production and marketing of crude oil, natural gas, un-
processed and processed natural gas liquids, and liquefied 
petroleum gas for Sun Company, Inc. In 1982, Sun Company, 
Inc., ranked 10th in sales and 13th in net income among 
domestic energy companies, according to the Business Week 
list of major American industrial corporations. 

OGML 
Wallace Co. Inc. To B.L. 

White & Wife Rel. OGL 
David Windham & Wife To 

Sun Exploration & Prod. Co. 
Electrical R/W Agree. 

David Windham & Wife To 
Sun Exploration & Prod. Co. 
R/W Esmt 

91st Dist. Court 
Oneta 	Robinson 

Rothfelder vs Lawrence 
Cannon Oil Co. Property 
Damages 

Dowell Div. of Dow 

Chemical vs Kahan Energy 
Corp. and Reliance Oil & Gas 
Corp. Judgement 

to Driling depth 
Roh

rem500'6000'
otf aryl  Rig 

AN Rigs Radio Equipped with 24 hr. 
answering service plus phone patch. 

Gory Snapp, Vice President & Operation 
Mgr. 

Res. Phone 817/647-3416 
23 Yrs. Oilfield Experience 

BOTTOM LINE 
Sales and other operating income of $16 billion and net in-

come of $537 million. Of this Sun Company, Inc., total, Sun 
Exploration and Production Company contributed $3.6 billion 
in sales and other operating income and $545 million before 
net financing expenses and after tax. 

EMPLOYEES 
5,500 worldwide, 2,200 in Dallas 

PRESENCE 
1st in net income, 8th in revenues, and among the top 30 

employers in Dallas-headquartered businesses. 
International exploration offices are located in London, 

Singapore, Khartoum, and Maracaibo. 
Domestic exploration region or land offices are located in 

Dallas, Denver, Houston, Abilene, Beaumont, Midland (TX), 
Oklahoma City, Shreveport, Lafayette, Jackson, Lansing, 
and Ventura. 

Production operations district offices are located in 
Houston, Abilene, Longview, Corpus Christi, Midland (TX), 
Oklahoma City, Denver, Lafayette, Valencia (CA), and 
Midland (MI). 

Property, field offices, gas processing plants or gas 
marketing facilities are located offshore and in 25 of the 50 
states. 

EXPLORATION 
115 net exploratory wells and 720 net development wells 

were drilled in the United States and overseas in 1982. 
5 million developed and 17.5 million undeveloped gross 

acres are owned in the United States. Overseas, the company 
holds 32 million net acres. 

Domestic activity is concentrated in the Western Over-
thrust Belt, Williston and Anadarko Basins, Santa Barbara 
Channel, Gulf of Mexico, and Baltimore Canyon. Interna-
tional activity currently is unde way in the North Sea and on-
shore United Kingdom, Nigeria, Sudan, France, Dubai, and 
the South China Sea. 

Ridge Oil Co. Inc. To Com-
pressor Rental Serv. & 
Others Asgn OGL 

Snyder Mineral Trust To 
Bingo Oil & Gas Inc. OGL 

State of Texas To Pengo 
Industries Inc. Rel. State 
Tax Lien 

Billy V. Stewart To Mina 
Enterprises Inc. Warranty 
Deed 

Billy V. Stewart To Mina 
Enterprises Inc. Bill of Sale 

Southeastern Resources 
Corp. To Dan Flournoy & 
Others Asgn ORR 

Sentinel Petroleum Corp. 
To Alton Smith dba Asgn 

Ottoman Schertz To Alton 
W. Smith dba Asgn OGL 

Laurence F. Squires To 
Elmer Tidwell OGML 

Transierra Explor. Corp. 
to Petroleum Financial 
Corp. F/S 

Gregg Thomas To James 
Gregory Thomas Trust by 
Trustee Asgn OGL 

USA To M&S Oil & Gas 
Inc. Fed Tax Lien 

USA To Dan Nitschke 
Drlg. Corp. Rel. Fed Tax 
Lien 

Leona Isaphene Watson To 
Leonard Bros. Oil & Gas 

unariene Turner Pierce To 
Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
Ratif. OGML 

L. Frank Pitts dba To 
Hanvey Oil Co. Asgn 

Don Phillips To Alton W. 
Smith dba Asgn OGL 

L.P. Pearson Jr. Inc. To 
L.R. Pearson III & Others 
Asgn OGL 

Regina C. Port & Others 
To Pete 0. Johnson Asgn 

N.E. Richardson & Wife 
To Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
R-W & Esmt 

N.E. Richardson & Wife 
To Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
R-W & Esmt 

N.E. Richardson & Wife 
To Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
R-W & Esmt 

N.E. Richardson & Wife 
To Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
R-W & Esmt 

N.E. Richardson & Wife 
To Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
R-W & Esmt 

N.E. Richardson & Wife 
To Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
R-W & Esmt 

City of Ranger To Sun Ex-
plor. & Prod. Co. OGML 

Republic Gas Gathering 
Systems Inc. to E.J. Porter 
Asgn OGL 

REPORT OIL FIELD THIEVES 
CALL 

1-800-OIL-COPS 
1-800-6452677 

TOLL FREE ..... _REWARD 

Heald Remtion Hosted by Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack White 

Broomfield, Colo.,and 
Jennifer 	Pell, 
Bakersfield, Ca. On 
Wednesday evening 
special guests were 
Jack's 	sisters, 

Kathleen Hardesty, 
Rising Star, Agnes 
Baskin, Lamesa, Tex., 
and Merle Schooler 
from O'Donnell, Tex. 

re.  

PRODUCTION 
In 1982, average daily net production was nearly 200,000 

barrels of crude oil and condensate, 34,500 barrels of natural 
gas liquids, and 915 million cubic feet of natural gas. 

Interest is held in 47,500 gross producting oil and gas wells 
onshore and offshore, and in 80 natural gas processing plants. 

Proved reserves totalled 622 million barrels of crude oil 
and condensate, 75 million barrels of natural gas liquids, and 
3.25 trillion cubic feet of natural gas. 

COME JOIN US AT 

IL 

E.E. Agnew & Others To 
J&J Investments, Partner-
ship Warranty Deed 

Nathan L. Apple To XX-
ANADU, Ltd. Asgn OGL 

Burelsmith Oil Co. Inc. To 
Mike McCormick & Others 
Asgn OGL 

Thomas 0. Blakeney To 
Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. 
OGML 

Bruner Oil & Gas Inc. To 
North Park Nati Bk D-T 
Agree. F/S 

Terry W. Bradley To Alton 
W. Smith dba Asgn OGL 

Ernest A. Bates To Alton 
W. Smith dba Asgn OGL 

Oscar D. Cunningham & 
Wife To Sun Explor. & Prod. 
Co. R-W & Esmt 

Joseph A. Chandler To Sun 
Explor. & Prod. Co. OGL 

Grace Chandler Colwick to 
Sun Explor. & Prod. Co. OGL 

Cora Tibbels Copeland by 
Agent & AF To Sun Explor. 
& Prod. Co. OGML 

Dean H. Crowell To Sun 
Explor. & Prod. Co. OGML 

Reid K. Crowell To Sun 
Explor. & Prod. Co. OGML 

Diamond Shamrock Corp. 
To Raw Energy Inc. Asgn 
OGML 

Ensource, Inc. to Geo. W. 
Steel & Wife Rel. OGL 

Eastland Natl Bk To 
Dallas Sunbelt Oil & Gas Inc. 
'Rel. MML 

Prickett Freeman Inc. & 
Others To Lottie M. Roach & 
Others Rel. OGML 

E.w. Gummelt Jr. To 
Melisa Elizabeth Gummett 
Asgn OGL 

C.J. Gautrean & Wife To 
Belmont Oil Co. Asgn 

Adrian Hastings To Daniel 
M. Leonard Ratif. OGL 

Lee Heathington to John 
Holstenbach Corr. Asgn 
OGL Part. hit. 

J&J Investment Partner-
ship To 1st Natl Bk-Gordon 
Deed of trust 

D.D. Jackson & Wife to 
KM&D Energy Inc. OGL 

Thurman L. Jay Jr. & 
Others To William Lee Jay 
Asgn ORR 

J&J Investments To First 
Natl Bk, Cisco Deed of Trust 

Don Jordan Oil Co. Inc. To 
Southwest State Bk Deed of 
Trust 

Patricia P. Krohn To Sun 
Exploration & Prod. Co. 
OGML 

Marcella Luna To Alton W. 
Smith dba Asgn OGML 

Mina Enterprises, Inc. To 
Graham Say. & Ln. 
Ass'n.-Graham F/S 

Mina Enterprises, Inc. To 
Graham Say. & Ln. 
Ass'n.-Graham Deed of 
Trust 

R.O. McCarty & Wife To 
Bergen Enterprises Asgn 
OGL 

L.R. Pearson & Wife To 
Pearson-Adams Inc. OGL 

Petroleum Corp. of Tex. 
To Petco Ltd. Deed Con-
veyance & Asgn 

Primrose Oil Co. Inc. To 
Wesley D. Bryant Rel. 

hstract of Judg. 

Jack and Lavonne 
White hosted the Heald 
family reunion at 
Mountain View Lodge 
June 27th to June 30. 

The brothers and 
sisters, nieces and 
nephews of Lavonne 
came from eight dif-
ferent states. The 
Healds started their 
family re-union in Col-
orado in 1949. 

Guests were: Doris 
and John Branton from 
El Cajon,Ca., and 
Doris Heald , Jackson-
ville, Fla., Earl and 
Kay Heald, Grand 
Junction, 	Colo., 
Lawrence 	and 
Florence Heald, 
Marion, Montana, 
Howard and Cass 
heald, Atlantic City, 
N.J., Lucille and 
Stanley Maxson, 
Riverton, Wyo., Frank 
and Verna Jean Matis, 
Seabrook, N.H.. Two 
brothers, Kenneth 
Heald from Gypsum, 
Colo., and Charles 
Heald, El Cajon, Cal., 
were unable to attend 
the re-union. Nieces 
and nephews present 
were: John and Joanne 
Heald and two 
daughters, Jamie and 
Janice, 	from 
Oklahoma City, Okla., 
Alice and Dick Stark 
from San Diego, Ca., 
Earl, Kathleen and 
Shirley Maxson from 
Riverton, Wyo., Bever-
ly and Roy Edge and 
sons Randy and 
Daniel, Greenville, 
S.C., Carol Pickens 
and daughter Cara, 

EW 
IN dE511% 

This used to 
be a forest. 

Aug. 1-5 7-9 P.M. 
1-20 Church of Christ 

Cisco, Texas 



Senior Center News 

Mr. & Mrs. Ed Witt 

PAT MAYNARD REAL ESTATE 
629-8568 EASTLAND INT. 20 E. NORTH SIDE 442-1880 CISCO 

Homes: Eastland, Ranger and Carbon 
3 bedroom, 11/2  bath frame home on large 

lot, living/dining room area with fireplace, 
large kitchen with separate utility, 
breezeway between garage, fruit trees. 
$35,000. 

3 bedroom, 1% bath brick home on large lot. 
Will have new carpet, paint and other repairs 
made. Built-ins with central heat and air. 
$41,500. 

3 bedroom, 1 bath 2 story frame home, 
separate living and den, large master 
bedroom and kitchen. $27,500. 

A 2 bedroom, 1 bath 1977 Centurion Mobile 
Home (14 x60) on 3 lots (150 x 140), a good buy 
at $12,000. 

A 3 bedroom, 134 bath brick home in the 
prestigous Crestwood addition, large living 
area with fireplace, beautiful large lot. 
$77,000. 

In Ranger, a beautiful stucco 3 bedroom, 1 
bath home, detached garage, storage 
buildings. $39,000. 

A 2 bedroom (could be 3), 1 bath older brick 
home, take up monthly payment of $497.12 
and assume loan. Can be refinanced. 

In Gorman, 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home, 
on 21/2  lots with separate garage and storage. 
$30,000. 

Located in Carbon. A 2 bedroom home on 
one acre. Just like living in the country and 
only $16,000. 

We have a very nice 4 bedroom, 3 bath brick 
home on 3 lots. This home has everything 
most anyone could ever want in a home. Call 
for details. 

Want a new home? We have large lots 
available in exclusive area. City water, 
sewer, and paved streets. This area is 
restricted to brick homes only. Reasonably 
priced from $4500 to $5500. 

New homes in the exclusive Oakhollow 
brick home addition. Call for an appointment. 

New on the Market! A 2 bed, 1 bath home, 
formal dining area, central heat/air, 
carpeted, nice modern cabinets with 
dishwasher. $35,000. 

Only 9 months old this 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath 
brick home in exclusive area. Custom made 
drapes, fireplace, and other extras. $67,000. 

A very nice 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath brick 
home, separate living room and den. $50,500. 

Large master bedroom in this 3 bedroom, 2 
bath home on one of our better streets, fur-
nished. Owner finance at 9% interest. $40,000. 

SmaN Acreage With Homes 

21/2  acres of Staff road near Lake Leon with 
water well and tool house. Nice place for 
home. Only $7500. 

In Carbon, 3 bedroom, 1'/4 bath, rock home 
on 4 acres, shop barn, fruit trees. $31,500. 

Located In Kokomo, 141/2  acres, beautiful 
place for a house, city water and well. $15,000 
(will consider $5,000 down, remainder at $200 
per month at 10% interest) 

In Carbon, 9.3 acres with 3 bedroom, 11/2  
bath moible home (12 x 65) located on 
Highway 6, 52 pecan trees, wells, beautiful 
place, $35,500. (Will consider small down, re-
mainder over 10 years, 10% interest.). 

A large 3 bedroom, 2 bath mobile home (14 
x 72) on 5.69 acres, located on FM 2214, with 
14110 attached greenhouse, A-frame and 
other storage buildings, city water, all this for 
$43,000. 

Out of Cisco, 10 acres northwest off of old 
Abilene Hwy., City water and electricity. 
$14,500. 

mainder in pasture. 45% minerals with leas-
ing rights. $583 per acre. 

160 acres off of Highway 183 eight miles 
south of Cisco, 100 acres cultivation, re-
mainder trees, oil/gas production. $600 per 
acre. 

120 acres south of Cisco on 206 and 569, 2 
bedroom, 11/2  bath brick home, hay barn, cor-
als, storage buildings, 2 irrigation wells and 
pipe, 11 pecan trees, 1/2  minerals. $136,000. 

In Olden, 3 bedroom, 13/4  bath brick home on 
1 acre, carport, central heat/air, fruit trees. 
$57,500. 

Located in Ranger! A 4 bedroom, 1 bath 
frame home on 5 acres with an old motel on 
this property. Home is in good condition. All 
this for only $55,000. 

30 acres near Cisco with 1-20 frontage. A 
very versatile place. Would be a good location 
for a business or home. $45,000. 

A very nice 3 bedroom, 13/4  bath stone and 
brick home on 4.38 acres. Carpeted, central 
heat and air, fireplace, bookshelves, screened 
porch, and many other extras in this 2150 sq. 
ft. home. $88,500. 

5.3 acres near Lake Leon with a 2 bed 
mobile home 14x70. Carpeted, central 
heat/air, house type windows, special siding. 
Storage building and city water. $35,000. 

16 acres near Eastland, with 1-20 frontage. 
In 4 acre tracts $4500 per acre, 16 acre tract, 
$4,000 per acre. 

Located near Union Center: 2 bedroom, 1 
bath home on approximately 38 acres. This 
house is a dream place in the country. $70,000. 

A 3 bedroom, 21/2  bath, two story 3000 sq. ft. 
brick home only 3 years old situated on 10 
acres, unique petrified wood fireplace, close 
to Eastland. $105,000. 

Beautiful 3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home 
with built-ins, central heat/air, ceiling fans, 
covered patio, 2 car garage plus other extras. 
3 acres near Breckenridge. $82,000. 

Farms & Ranches 
A 3 bed, brick home on 160 acres near Plea-

sant Hill with approximately 74 acres of 
cultivation, 1/2  minerals that seller owns goes 
with property. Seller will also consider split-
ting. $160,000 for total acreage. 

40 acres located south of Cisco on 183, nativt 
pasture with scattered pecan trees, one well 
and tank, fenced (3) sides $42,000. 

Near Eastland and Lake Leon, 49.6 wooded 
acres with six tanks and spring on farm road 
2214, good place to hunt and fish, assumable 
loan. $60,000. 

Beautiful can only be used to describe this 
property. 70 acres on 1-20 with lots of nice 
trees, four tanks, 1 spring fed and 1 extra 
large. Good fences, 1/2  minerals with leasing 
rights. Not leased, but does have two old oil 
wells on it. Also a camping cabin included. 
$98,000. Make an offer. 

Near Lake Leon, a 20 acre tract of land. 
Some cultivation and good hunting area. 
$30,000. 

62 acres near Union Center. Approximately 
25 acres in cultivation. Good fences, 54 
minerals. $700 per acre. Owner will carry 2nd 
or part of down payment. 

320 acres located between Carbon and Gor-
man. Some cultivation but mostly wooded. 
Good fences and hunting, some minerals in-
cluded. $500 per acre. Owner financed at 9%. 

5 acres near Eastland. 1-20 frontage. $5,000 
per acre. Terms can be arranged. 

Located south of Cisco, 50 acres with ap-
proximately 35 acres of pecan trees. Owner 
will consider terms. $74,200. 

248 acres located on old Abilene highway 
west of Cisco, mostly cleared with some 
wooded acreage, good fences, 1/2  minerals 
with leasing rights. $530 per acre. 

100 acres between Lake Leon and 
Desdemona, all in cultivation and coastal, 
good 5 wire fence and cross fence, shallow 
water. $800 per acre. Owner finance at 9%. 

NO acres approximately 17 miles northwest 
of Breckenridge, with 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
frame house, 175 acres cultivation with re- 

Cisco Homes 
A 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home, double 

carport, storage building. $22,000. 
2 or 3 bedroom, carpeted home with central 

heat and air. Surrounded by beautiful oak 
trees. Paved street. Also has large shop and 
garage. 

Nice 2 bedroom, carpeted home with at-
tached garage. Central air and heat. Built in 
oven, range-top and dishwasher. On brick 
street. 

2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home. New carpet, 
large rooms. Nice trees and shrubbery. 
Owner financing available. $22,500. 

Large 4 bedroom frame home; carport and 
storage room, several clusters of beautiful 
oak trees in back yard. $29,500. 

A 4 bedroom, 134 bath 2 story stone home on 
2 big lots; privacy fence around swimming 
pool. Also has small efficiency rental unit. 
$34,900. 

Large 2 story with 5 bedroom, 2 baths, den 
separate dining and breakfast rooms, located 
on 2 big corner lots. Also has a nice roomy 
apartment attached. Beautiful landscaped 
yard with lots of trees. 

A 3 bedroom, 11/2  bath brick home with cen-
tral heat and air, carpeted, and double 
garage. Fenced back yard, with several fruit 
trees. Assumable loan, no down, take up 
payments. 

This large 2 bedroom, 2 bath frame home 
has separate dining and living rooms, 
spacious kitchen cabinets and a one bedroom 
apartment rental above garage. $28,000. 

A new 4 bedroom, 2 bath home on .46 acre 
lot, central heat and air, large carport and 
storage room, with fireplace and storm win-
dows. 

3 lots: 2 bedroom home, has large rooms, 
garage and big storage building. 

Weekend cabin on Lake Cisco. 
WE NEED MORE CISCO LISTINGS!! 

Commercial 

Located near downtown, an older building 
that would make a good location for a 
business. $35,000. 

In Cisco, a 100' x 50' building with office 
space and shop area of 4400 sq. ft. Owner will 
finance on this one with reasonable down pay-
ment and interest. $75,000 for building or 
$95,000 for everything as is, as a business. 

In Eastland, a new metal building, 2400 sq. 
ft. with dock area. $38,000. 

In Ranger, a large 2 story brick building 
with good sized fenced yard. Located near 
railroad tracks with spur. $85,000. 

Located near downtown! A two story brick 
building, 4 lots and a house. All this for 
$40,000. Will consider splitting. 

Valuable 1-20 property! Approximately 
4,600 sq. ft. building very versatile, easy ac-
cessability. $77,500. 

In Cisco, a nice brick building with 5,000 sq. 
ft. in prime downtown location, near new 
bank. $60,000. 

For commercial use only. One to five acres 
with 1-20 frontage. 

For lease. 2 story brick building near 
downtown Eastland. $250 per month. 

Located on Main Street, a 10,000 sq. ft. 
building. Ideal location for a business. Extra 
lots goes with this one. $135,000, owner will 
finance with good terms. 

WE HAVE OTHER HOME, LAND AND 
COMMERCIAL LISTINGS 

PAY MAYNARD 
eroksi 

629-8063 

CINDYE FOSTER ANN WILLIAMS WAYNE CHANDLER 
Associate 	Associate 	 Associate 
629-8195 	442-1880 	 7342782 

KAY BAILEY 

Associate 

629-2365 

NOLAN BUTLER 

Associate 
629-8106 

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 1983 

Last Thursday was a 
good day at the center. 
We had a few absent 
due to illness and some 
on vacation. Our presi-
dent Luella McKin- 
nerney is vacationing 
in Corpus Christi. 

Some of the ladies 
are still canning and 
freezing their garden 
produce. the gardens 
will soon be through 
due to dry hot weather 
and insects. 

Jerald and Wanda 
Bible from Virginia, 
are visiting their 
parents, Alvy and Dell 
Bible and Eunice 
Smith. 

Bill Henry from 
Hamlin, visited his 
great-grandmother, 
Lela Clark recently. 

Juanita Hollis and 
son, Justin visited our 

• club Thursday. 
Edith Bostick talked 

to her youngest grand-
son, Bryan Bostick on 
his third birthday. 
Bryan lives in 
Roosevelt, Utah, with 
his brother Kirk, his 

Yard of the Week 
gram. We hope you en-
joyed your visit to our 
center and will come 
again soon. 

Marjorie West 

weeks of vacation, 
before starting again 
next month on bus 
trips, putting on pro-
rams that we had to 
reschedule, so we 
could have some time 
to finish our work at 
home and some to take 
their vacation. 

Can This 
Happen In 
America? 

daddy Terry and 
mother Cindy. 

Vernon and Artie 
Jaggers visited Mr. & 
Mrs. E.F. Agnew in 
Abilene, recently. 

Larry Earp and 
sons, Hurchel and 
Gerand visited Margie 
Earp. Larry and fami-
ly live in Eules, Tex. 

Opal and Fermon 
Dean were visited by 
their granddaughter 
from Colorado City. 

Dona and Bill Priest 
from Del Rio, visited 
Ben and Berna Lee 
Chick last weekend. 
Their daughter return-
ed home after spen-
ding several weeks 
with her grandparents. 

Marion and Marjorie 
West, and grandson 
Kurt Brown, spent last 
weekend in Seagraves, 
visiting Parker and 
Valeria Metcalf; while 
their they went to 
Carlsbad Caverns. 
Everyone enjoyed the 
tour. 

The Star Brites have 
been enjoying a few 

Honorable Mention 

The California Farm 
Labor Board decided 
that grower Paul Ber-
tuccio illegally sold his 
1979 garlic crop for 
seed, rather than 
harvest it for fresh 
market which would 
have required more 
workers. 

The Board said that 
such a decision must 
be cleared with the 
United Farm Workers 
Union 	which 
represents his work 
force. 

The Board ruled Ber-
tuccio owed farm 
workers more than $3 
million in back wages 
as a result of his 
harvest decision. 

Bertuccio has since 
declared he is quitting 
farming after 41 years 
in the vegetable 
business. 

Mr. & Mrs. Kenneth 
Brown of Carrollton, 
visited her parents, 
Marion and Marjorie 
West, her sister, 
Juanita Hollis and 
family and her 
brother, Oliver West 
and family. Their son, 
Kurt returned home 
after spending three 
weeks with his grand-
parents. 

We extend our sym-
pathy to the family of 
Joe Fox in the loss of 
their loved one, Mary 
Elizabeth Fox and to 
the Key family in the 
loss of their loved one, 
Mrs. Dean Key, who 
died from injuries due 
to an accident. Mrs. 
Key was a daughter-in-
law of LaDell Key. 

Louella McKin-
nerney shares her 
recipe this week for 

Mexican Casserole. 
Mexican Casserole 

2 lbs. ground meat 
1 large onion chopped 
1 can cream of chicken 
soup 
1 can cream of 
mushroom or tomato 
sauce 
1 can green chilies, 
chopped 
I large can evaporated 
milk 
1/2  lb. Velveta cheese 
16 tortillas-broken in 
small pieces 

Brown meat and 
onions in 1 tablespoon 
fat. 

Putt of the tortillas 
in the bottom of a large 
greased baking dish, 
add one half of the 
meat and onion mix-
ture, and 1/2  of the li-
quid; and 3/4  of the 
grated cheese, then 
add the remaining 
meat, tortillias, and li-
quid. Top with the re-
maining cheese and 
bake at 375 for 45 min. 

Mrs. Pat Walker was 
our visitor Thursday. 
She played a number 
of beautiful piano solos 
for us. We want to give 
a big thank you to Pat 
for this wonderful pro- 

Mr. & Mrs. Pete Starks 

Mr. & Mrs. Weldon Lee 

Sipe Springs Homecoming Set 
For This Weekend 

Sipe Springs will 
celebrate their annual 
homecoming this 
weekend, first with a 

everyone is cordially 
invited to bring their 
chicken 	and 
fellowship. 

Musical Saturday, Ju-
ly 30 at 7:30 p.m. at the 
double tabernacle. 
Sunday, July 31, 



643-1601 

Trails West 
"The Way The West Is 

Helping Your Town Growl 	
Clothed" 

 

Bibby's Creations 
Winner of the Governor's 

Expansion Award 

643-6691 
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Jenkins Insurance 
Co. 

Mildred Childers and 
Juanita Boyett 
643-2251 

P.11••••••=.4.1M.1 34=8/..11••••• 

Rainbow Cafe 
Joyce Baker & 

Robin Reeves 

643-3000 

Jim Ratliff 
Welding 

643-6464 
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The Rising Star 
Your Hometown 

Newspaper 

643-4141 

WORSHIP IN THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE THIS SUNDAY 

Chamber of 
Commerce 

.rIMor • nalllarl./..••=• 

Bible Baptist Church 
	 141=1.14=••••••••••••=1 

Calvary Full Gospel 
Assembly 

......•••••=111.1•4•111•• •••=11.••••••••=1. 

Church of Christ 
643-6162 

In.•••Min 	•••••••••=•• • ••••=1, 	 .11=1.14=1,..•=111 

Mountain Top Church 
643-3627 
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Methodist Church 
643-3791 
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First Baptist Church 
643-4451 

Twin Drillhig & 
Well Service 

John G. Lee, Owner 

643-7100 

Hutton Insulation 

725-6683 

••••••••••••••1411.111..F.M..+M.1411....M...•••••••••••  

The Wishing Well 
Flowers and Gifts 

Rising Star, Texas 76471 

643-2023 
MINMI.1.101=..1•11.11•0•11.0.11=•••••=1.4•MIE....MINKI.1•1•001•11.. 

Palace Drug Store 
Professional Prescription 

Service 

643-3231 

Family Food Store i Butler Motor 

1 
1 	Company 

I 	643-3261 

+1.111.141M1.0i. P4M+.1•1•1.0.1 

643-2221 
Mon.-Sat. 7:30 - 6:30 

Sun. 8 to 6 

Medley Motor 
Company 

Quality Workmanship 

643-6211 

11.11.0.11111•Fl 

Kountry Kitchen 

643-6831 

Jack Hubbard 
Soil Conservation 

Contractor 
817/643-6242 

Chambers Grocery 

643-5292 

Higginbothams 

`We Have What You Want'S 
643-2271 

Kizer Insurance Co. 
All Forms Of Insurance: 
Life, Health. Auto, and I 

Fire 
643-4421 
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MID BE THAriliFUL Baby Shower Honors 
Nannette Goldston 

A baby shower wui 
be given for Randy and 
Nannette Goldston 
Saturday, July 30 in 
the Community Room 
at First State Bank 
from 2:00 to 3:30 p.m. 

The hostesses invite 
friends and relatives to 
attend the shower. 

Selections have been 
made at Palace Drug 
Store and Higgin-
bothams. 

De Leon Will Celebrate 
69th Annual Peach 
& Melon Festival 

• kf 
. 11011MIFS met %P.> 

Cleaning 
A 

✓ 
elf 

Water Overflows 
Floor Waxing 

%.j.• 

Commercial & Residential 

915-356-3813 r 

COUPON MUST BE PRESENTED AT TIME OF PURCHASE. 
SELUNG PRICE AND DISCOUNT MAY VARY BY DEALER. 
DEALER PARTICIPATING IN DISCOUNT. 

Bramiett Implement 
Inc. Of Rising Stir 

P403-4311 Mark Cooksey, Manager 

JOI 14 nit .0 

JOHN DEERE 
OWER 
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RIDING 

SUM ER 
SALE 
A John Deere riding mower is an easy way to 
take the legwork out of lawn work. And if you take 
advantage of the summer sale coupon offer, you 
can save an additional $100 or $150 

The $100 coupon applies to the 5-hp 65 Rider 
with 28-inch mower. The $150 coupon applies to 
the 8-hp 68 Rider, available in three models: with 
30-inch mower and recoil or electric start, or with 
34-inch mower and electric start Availability is 
limited to current stock at participating dealers. 
So buy now and save both dollars and legwork. 

This coupon worth $100 toward the purchase price of 
a new John Deere 65 Riding Mower or $150 toward the 
purchase price of a new John Deere 68 Riding Mower. 
Customer please fill In: 

Nan, 	 
(please shod 

Address 

Town  
	

Stale 	 Z.P 	  

SN 	  

Customer: Coupon void where prohibited by law. Prices 
subject to change without notice and may vary by dealer You 
are required to pay applicable sales lax on value of goods. 
And you must lilt in your name and address in places 
provided on this coupon. Otter may be withdrawn on short 
notice by John Deere 

Dealer please WI In: 

Save Work ... 
Save Money 

Name 	  
(ofease pont) 

Breech Cone 

C P Atci No 	 ML 	  

Dealer: You are authorized to act as our agent for redemption 
of this coupon in accordance with the terms thereof. Limit one 
coupon per.ilder. Dealer must till in name and account 
number — presentation for redemption without such 
compliance constitutes fraud. Offer may be withdrawn on 
short notice by John Deere. 

Possible High from'On High' 

AUK/4401 /  
17/117PNESS 

"THESE THING5 HAVE I 
SPOKEN UNTO YOU, THAT 
MY JOY MIGHT REMAIN 
IN YOU, AND THAT YOUR 
JOY MIGHT 13E FULL. /1  

CW/e/57 (1N. /5://) 

THE FALLACY OF 
FEELINGS: The just 
shall live by faith, 
Romans 1:17. It is a 
truth that one of the 
prime things that peo-
ple try to hold on to is 
one of the first ant1  
easiest shaken...a:::d 
that is in the area of 
`feelilng,' which often 
results in our acting 
out of presumption...a 
hoping. People say, "I 
feel I should do this," 
or "I feel I should do 
that." Often, tragical-
ly, what they are feel-
ing is something far 
removed from what 
God has stated ex-
pressly in His un-
changing Word. There 
is a vast difference bet-
ween feeling and that 
inner knowing of faith 
that is a spiritual at-
tibute. We need to dif-
ferentiate between the 
two. Feelings are not a 
"fixed point" for our 
faith. Many diverse 
factors enter into how 
we feel. It is relatively 
easy for Satan to 
tamper with feelings to 
deceive the unwary. 
The danger is en-
sampled in the story of 
Jacob deceiving his 
father, Isaac, as 
recorded in Genesis 
27:22, And Jacob went 
near unto his father; 
and he felt him, and 
said...the hands are 
the hands of Esau. 
Lack of sleep or too 
much sleep, our diet, 
our relationships, lack 
of paryer, pressures, 
financial problems, 
physical illness, an 
unkind word...so many 
things both trivial and 
great can play havoc 
with our feelings. 
Thank God for the joy 
of the Lord! Joy is an 
emotion, it is true, but 
the real joy of the Lord 
sterns from a deep 
down knowing rela-
tionship of God's 
Presence. That is why 
it is so important that 
we press past our feel-
ings, into a place of 
stability and joy based 
on our fixed point in 
God. The great shak-
ing and trouble times 
that is to come in a 
very short time, in 
every area of our lives 

DeLeon will be 
celebrating its 69th an-
nual Peach and Melon 
Festival this year on 
August 1 thru 6. 

All activities are 
held on the festival 
grounds located on 
Highway #6 and all 
events are at night. We 
have an exhibition 
building that holds 40 
booths size 10 X 10. 
These booths are  

will play a great part 
in how we feel. That is 
why we must now, 
before it comes, get 
ourselves anchored in 
that place of knowing. 
Not only will our emo-
'lonal feelings fall us 
but the perceptions of 
all our physical senses 
are vulnerable and 
open to deception. We 
are all born with five 
physical senses: We 
taste, we feel, we see, 
we hear, we smell. 
When we become the 
children of God, born 
into His kingdom 
through a spiritual 
birth, we are born with 
a sixth sense that we 
call faith. This sense is 
apart from, separate 
from, the five natural 
senses and is not based 
upon any of them. It is 
based on that "fixed 
point" which will not 
waver. When people 
rely on their feelings, 
their emotions, their 
senses, they will find 
failure, defeat and 
despair. Having leaned 
totally upon them, they 
will, in fact find panic 
when they realize the 
feeling is gone, that 
their perceptions have 
failed. 

I have read what 
happens to people, 
even experienced 
woodsmen, who get 
lost in the forest. Many 
lose their heads. In 
reality they are not ac-
tually lost...they just 
lose their bearings for 
a moment and, becom-
ing panic stricken, do 
things, irrational 
things, that often lead 
to tragedy or death. 
This condition is called 
being "bushed!' Often 
in their distress these 
people will throw away 
the very instruments 
necessary for their 
safety. Bodies of 
hunters have been 
found who have thrown 
away their guns or 
discarded their shoes 
and clothing. Some 
become so confused 
that they do not 
recognize the right 
path when they cross 
it. Our fixed point is 
God's Holy Word, the 
Bible. It is our road 
map to Heaven. 

decorated by civic 
groups, commercial 
firms and 4-H clubs. 

The entrance fee is 
$1.00 for all over 12 
years old. All pro-
grams are free except 
the Tuesday night pro-
gram and the charge is 
$5.00 all over 12 and the 
Tractor Pull and the 
charge is $4.00 all over 
6 years old. 

The Youth Depart-
ment of First Baptist 
Church enjoyed a 
spaghetti supper Fri-
day night at the Activi-
ty Center. The meal 
was followed by fun 

You are cordially in-
vited to attend a wed-
ding shower honoring 
Janetta Lawrence, 
bride-elect of Landry 
Holmes, Saturday, Ju-
ly 30, 1983 from 
3:00-5:00 p.m. at the 
Fellowship Hall, First  

and games. On Satur-
day the group spent the 
day at Six Flags. Area 
youth are invited to 
join the group for ac-
tivities. 

Baptist Church. 
Janetta is the 

daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. 	Aubrey 
Lawrence. Landry is 
the son of Rev. and 
Mrs. Doyle Holmes of 
Lubbock. 

Commentary 
by Myrtle Owen 

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 1983 

First Baptist Church 

Wedding Shower To Honor 

Janetta Lawrence 

Comanche, Texas 
Managed by 

Lynn McDonald 
e 



F ARMERS 

Super

66  

HD 11 
SAE 30 

MOTOR OIL 

5 Gallon 
$24.95 

1. Proven Quality 

CD 	Series 3 
MIL-L-2104C 
for mixed fleets 
For: tractors 

truck 
car engines 

Hydraulic Transmission Fluid. 

PHILLIPS 

66 
************************************************************** 	******* 

Rising Star, • 

Texas 
643-1000 

RANCHERS • 
HEAVY EQUIPMENT 

OPERATORS 
Check With Us For All Of Your 
Farm Equipment. Heavy Equipment and Industrial Filters 

And Oils 
Also: Fram Filters, Tires, Batteries - Accessories 

If We Don't Have It We Will Try To Get It. 

Specially developed product meeting John Deere Specification J20A (Hy-Gard 
Fluid) and former specification J14B and J14C (Type 303 fluid). 

2. Other Applications 

a. Allis-Chalmers 

b. J. I. Case 

c. John Deere 	QUATROL 

d. Ford Tractor 

e. International Harvester 

f. Massey Ferguson 

g. White Farm 
Minneapolis-Moline 
Oliver 

Tractor manufacturers have not been able to agree on a single specification 
for a fluid suitable in all tractors. While Phillips HG FLUID cannot be offered 
as meeting all requirements for the various manufacturers' fluid 
specifications, (numberous manufacturers approve their own fluids) HG FLUID 
has demonstrated satisfactory performance and can be recommended for 
those tractors for which the manufacturer specifies the following products: 

PF-821 

Transmission, Differential and Hydraulic Oil — J1C-145 (Hi-Lo TCH Fluid) 
J1-C-185 (TFD-Fluid) and MS-1205 (TFD-11 Fluid) 

,J20A (HY-Gard) and former Specs J14B and J14C (Type 303 Fluid). 

Differential and Wet Brake Lubricant — Spec. M2C134-A, M2C53-A 
M2C41-B and M2C86-A. 

Hy-Tran Fluid, Spec. B-6 

Transmission Fluid, Spec. M-1110; Transmission, Hydraulic Oil, Spec. M-1127; 

Transmission Fluid, Extreme Pressure, Spec.M-1129A, M-1135. 

Hydraulic Oil UHTF Type 55 Fluid; White Farm Q-1766. 

	
 h. Detroit Diesel C-3 Fluid (Also C-2) for intermediate grade. 

Allison 

For Engines of: 
• Earthmovers 

Road-Building Machinery 
• Crawler or Wheel Tractors 
• Fleet Cars and Pickups 
• Gasoline & Diesel Trucks 
• Construction &FarmEauigment 

With Super HD II Motor Oil, the choice of 
oil selection is made easier. In most 
cases, will serve all the engines of mixed 
fleet operators with outstanding results. 



HOUSE OF WEBST 
Manufacturers of Fine Ceramic Wan 

for Horne and Industry 

Verna Little Stripes A Ceramic 

Feature 

Doing Things "The Old-Fashioned Way" 
By Gary Slade 

Staff Writer 
quarters in Arkansas when 
needed. 

A mold can be used for 
about 100 casts and can 
usually be cast about twice a 
day. 

When the slip comes out of 
the mold, greenware is pro-
duced. 

All the ceramics are 
stored at Eastland until 
needed and during the 
course of one year the 
Eastland plant will produce 
more than 150,000 ceramic 
containers for the Arkansas 
firm. 

According to Little, 
Eastland has one of the 
oldest professions known to 
man and the House of 
Webster in Eastland still 
makes the ceramics the old 
way-by hand. 

The House Of Webster 
Ceramics in Eastland may 
only employ 25 during its 
peak season but, the process 
of making ceramics at the 
plant is one to see and one 
that is important to Eastland 
County. 

The plant was actually 
started in Eastland at the 
end of World War II. Several 
owners tried their hand, or 
skill, at it before selling out 
to the House Of Webster 
Ceramics, based in Rogers, 
Arkansas, in 1970. 

again to make the decal or 
gold trim permanent to the 
ceramic. 

These items are then sent 
to the warehouse also where 
they are stacked on pallets 
and wraped with a plastic 
wrap called a srink wrap. 
The wraps may stand as 
much as eight feet tall and 
may contain anywhere from 
450 to 1500 ceramics on the 
pallet depending on their 
size. 

This greenware is sent to 
the finishing department 
where the seams are 
scraped, or taken off, and 
the pieces are smoothed and 
cleaned up before going to 
the drying room. 

From here the pallet is 
wraped with a metal band 
and shipped to the head- 

The Eastland process 
however, is not as simple as 
one might think. 

The raw material to make 
the clay comes in bagged 
and is shipped to Eastland 
by truck and by boxcar. Five 
ingredients are used to make 
the clay which come from as 
far away as Tennessee and 
South Carolina. The closest 
product used is a talc pro-
duct mined and processed 
near Van Horn, Texas. 

Once the raw materials ar-
rive at the plant workers will 
then mix the material pro-
ducing about 6,000 pounds of 
dry material at a time. Over 

Greenware is the term us-
ed for any cast that has not 
been fired, or have fire put to 
it. 

House Of Webster started 
in 1934 and is a company 
which sells food gift items to 
companies as gift items. 
These gift items may be dif-
ferent kinds of fruit or a mix-
ture of ham and bacon set in-
side a ceramic dish or bowl 
of some type. This is where 
the Eastland plant comes in-
to effect. 

Eastland is the only 
ceramic supplier for the 
company which sells gift 
items to companies in over 
40 states. 

Jimmy Little, owner and 
operator of the Eastland 
plant, says that his company 
helps your company 
remember someone through 
these gift items. 

The overall process of the 
item is a simple one. 
Eastland sends ceramics to 
Arkansas. From there the 
ceramics are filled with the 
food item, sealed for protec-
tion, and then sold to com-
panies to use as gifts. 

300 gallons of water is then 
added producing a substance 
known as slip. 

The slip is then screened 
over a fine screen to take out 
the impurities and then is 
pumped into one of two 
holding tanks where it is 
ready for use. 

After the greenware has 
had time to dry it is bisque 
fired without a blaze one 
time to make it eaiser to han-
dle and to take out all the im-
purities in the clay which 
might effect the glazing pro-
cess. 

From here the slip is sent 
to the casting department 
where it is poured into the 
casts for its shape. The 
molds are made out of a 
special industrial pottery 
plaster made for the pottery 
indusrty. 

The casting department 
will have over 12 to 14,000 
molds on hand of different 
shapes and sizes. 

Depending on the demand 
for the item the casting 
department may have as 
many as 200 molds of the 

• same item being used at one 
time. 

The Inside Of A Cast 

Staff Photos By 

Gary Slade 

All the items are fired at 
least two times and some 
items which have extra 
decorations are fired three 
times. 

A layer of glass, called 
glaze, is now applied to the 
ceramic body to both the in-
side and outside of the con-
tainer giving the ceramic a 
shine. The galze can be dip-
ped or sprayed onto the 
ceramic. 

After the glaze process the 
glaze is cleaned off of the 
bottom of the item so it will 
not stick to the bottom of the 
boards in the kiln or furnace 
during the firing process. 

A small cart moves the 
items through the kiln and 
will take about 14 hours start 
to finish. The kiln will heat 
up to 2000 degrees in the mid-
dle of the kiln. 

Two kilns are operated at 
the plant 24 hours a day, five 
days a week by three 
rotating shifts. 

When the product comes 
out of the kiln it has been 
reduced in size by about 10 
percent and only about 85 to 
90 percent of the items com-
ing out will be good as the re-
mainder are lost due to 
cracks or other problems. 

The cart can carry 35 to 50 
pieces through the kiln at 
one time. 

The product is then graded 
and stacked on pads. 

Some items have decals or 
gold trim put on them while 
other are simply finished 
and sent to the warehouse. 

Those requiring decals or 
gold trim have to be fired 

Ceramic Is Shaped 

In Casting Department 

Ceramics Exiting Kiln 

The Finished Product 
Greenware 

Awaiting Fire Ready For Shipping 
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Ranger, Texas 
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We can also help you with 

office supplies, personalized 

stationary and envelopes 

for your place of business. 
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A free press: 
Your key 
to freedom. 

  

For any of your office or 

business needs contact your 

local newspaper FIRST. 
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Your advertising dollars spent with 

Eastland County Newspapers will be 

returned to you by increased sales 

in your business. 

We can help you get the word about 

your business out in any of four towns 

or in all four at almost the same time. 
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Education: bring 
The joy of learning —
a life-long experience 

A student writes . . . and is 
answered with scholarships 

LOS ANC& 	- Patrick believe ti 
-atifornm high 	Mart Ann Mavin. Execu• 

awry tune Lb:echo of she Student 
said that 

era 	 , hundreds 
kt. 	 *Wiens have 

irk ranglng 
10.000 a year 

Scholarduri 

1. t '•1"-hrt ,„ • 	• . 

,111111 91 

ctn.: twone) usunes A mildew 
additional computer pratess• 
mg fee is required al the MIX 
111C student sends in his of her 
application form 

Applicants can often qualify 
for privately-donated college 
funds in the Scholarship 
Search dais base, because cer-
tain eligibility factors are im- 
portant. such as, 	eth- 
n ic backgrtsund. career 
interest. college mason, eatril- 
CUrriCUlar %Chou! 0,IVK 	- 
livilICS. parents union,. mili• 
taly wonce, etc. 

She said. ' Mollion, and 
million. -otilollals '01 whcid 
aid have gone unclaimed and 
unused m che past 10 years. 
because the money was not 
clairrui Computer, art es. 
rental to find the myriad of 

satiable leholarslugn. 
itching a high school 

n ear senior with a scholar-
manually would be vertu-
Impossible. CvlICCIAlly 

deahng with hundreds 
thousands of students. 
each one very, very ME 

said the Comerl has 
aid. more than 100.000 stu-
dents in the Iµ12 years. to-
csin% sonreel of college 

rite for Information 
for infon..ustri and ass, 

HI rucking down my., 
for college. wok to 	Stu- 
dent Auhaance Council 
lege Funds us then ne. ad-
dress. 800 Hu)ler Street. 
Teterboro. Nl 1.',6011, em los. 
ing $1.00 to cover postage and 
handling. 

-Cole unite And he was 
answered . . good... !damn 
smiled. 

Your Business Anniversary, or any other 
special occasions observed at your business 
are news in your local newspaper. Let us 
know about your plans today, so we can 
tell everyone in Eastland County. 

Education is a Ide-bong pm... not something which can 
sontatned within the wails of any school. however distingui 
It is as much a temtory for adults as children — there rs 
limn on curiosity Ptty the person who truly believes that 
she has nothing more to learn, because that person has ce 
grow' 

People karn by a variety of Inertmds Book•learnat 
course chief among them — as is the tmerchange of 
facts among pcopk. teacher to pupil pupil Co teat 
mristly people kart by opening themselves to 
them, by allowing their senses to interpret 
leaving their pares open. metaphors ally.'  
that nature and an and erudition have IA 

Whether 5tiur wheel:Ellie In on 
Teethe areas, or whether you , 
areenrinalled 'tly -tbeiy1hing'" 
the world has to offer, there's 
one precept always

n 
 to keep in 

nund There 	othIng 50 
small it 's not worth karning, 
nothing.. Urge. t snot svfosh 
tackling 

*Towards 

,000.000c.mthuter • 
>mars. bank con-
Ak0 1.10n0f awards, 

pitvately -funded 
vernment I sources 

shorn, trust funds. 
religious 

• rsal and social 
al tic. unions. 
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Perfect pie re 

Hough and rugged. Away 
ready. the Amencan co. ho 

• is a "stagerl.ro• unique to 
Amt tt“ culture With 
wide open

n 
 . western plains 

fit. pulsing ground. he is f 
nowned I err his courage 
limitude in the face of danger 

To preserve the memos-, 0  
thew western c hampton• it 
the paw and honor the hence 

Capturing the spot of sum 	inseam - 
riser in photograph, can he U. War fec', 
easy as froliclung in the sun 	log 1"... 
when you follow J less sun 	patty 
tips. pscluredaktng 	 Mit 

No matter how ideal 	this 
lighting and other conndo 
ultimately the quality of qty ,  
pauses depend, on the w 
you handle your Camc 

Although Many 
fiCW cameras arcC 
what appears in the 
an the result or nor 
close the shot 

Ono of the greatest ads 
tapes of an instant camera I 
that you can see your results 
immediately You can tell 
right assay when you wok the 
tore to compose a shot in the 
sics*filltICI or when you need 
to try agaio 
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O obituaries 	 
Jeannie Hey 
Vesta 	Jean 

"Jeannie" Key, 47, of 
Freeport, a teacher 
and former May area 
resident, died at 2:30 
a.m. Sunday at a 
Galveston hospital. 
Services were held at 3 
p.m. Wednesday at 
First United Methodist 
Church in May, 
directed by Higgin-
botham Funeral Home 
of Rising Star. 

The Rev. Lynn Mc-
Caden officiated, 
assisted by the Rev. 
Armo Bentley. Burial 
was in Sabanno 
Cemetery. 

Born Dec. 30, 1935, in 
Nimrod, she graduated 
from May High School 
in 1954 and from North 
Texas State University 
in 1971. She married 
Dean Key June 16, 
1954, in May. She was a 
member of the Texas 

Teachers 
Association and a 
Methodist. 

Survivors include 
her husband; three 
daughters, Debbie 
Dean Green of Gran-
bury, Pamela Dale 
Key of Alvin and Cyn-
thia Ann Brumbalow of 
Hillsboro; 	two 
brothers, Eldon Ray 
Erwin and Glenn Er-
win, both of San 
Angelo; two sisters, 
Linda Kay Williams of 
Austin and Peggy 
Smith of Albuquerque, 
N.M.; and three grand-
children. 

Mary Fox 
Mary Elizabeth Fox, 

81, of Rising Star died 
at 9:40 p.m. Wednes-
day in a Wichita Falls 
hospital. Services were 
at held at 2 p.m. Satur-
day at Higginbotham 
Funeral Home. 
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HOME TOWN 
COW POKES By Ace Reid 

• 

• 
"Wul, looks like Ole Wilbur is feedin' his horses 

their usual daily rations, a pint of oats and a 
bushel of splinters!" 

USE ALL OUR HANDY BANK SERVICES FOR A 
HEALTHFUL FINANCIAL DIET! EVERY SERVICE WE 

OFFER IS TO HELP YOU HELP YOURSELF TO THE 
ADVANTAGES OF FULL SERVICE BANKING! 

DRIVE-IN 
BANKING 

dm.N.v•%•••••••••••••••••,k‘•••••••••••wim.%%x s  

Mrtiihrr U.1).1.1 

RISING STAR, TEXAS 76471 

`as'iLiE)2 
AN 

0 	444 Rao • 
I- 2_1 

•111111•r 
40040 

EQUAL HOUSING 
LENDER 

FOR LEASE 
80-plus acres 

in best location 
in Eastland County 

to firm ready to 
DRILL 

Section 51, Block 3, 
H&TC 

Call 817-629-1707 
Write Box 29 

Eastland, Tx. 76448 

Snow 
011 Plaza 

Pipe & Supply 

Drilling Corp. 

Well Service 

Petroleum 
Land Leasing 

Terry Patty 
TC 

Off. (817) 6 29 8 5 21 

Linda Nelson 
Res. (817) 629 81 2 3 

629-8391 629-1725 
EASTLAND 

NEAR SCHOOLS-4 bdr. 1 1/2  baths on 2 lots. El 
LARGE 4 br., 2 b. sow , need of repairs. $18,000. E2 
ASSUMABLE LOAN, Large 3 bdr., 2 baths. E3 
ASSUME FHA No qualifying, 3 br. 1 bath cen. WA. E5 
CHARMING 2 STORY 4 bdr. beautifully decorated. E6 
LARGE 2 bdr., WA, corner fenced. Assume FHA. E7 
REMODELED frame 3 t sou) ventral heat. Neat. E8 
LARGE FAMILY? 4 bdr., sow  :h, brick, extras. E9 
LIKE NEW-2 bdr., br sow ome, cent. WA. El0 
EXTRA NICE 2 br. home-Priced right. Ell 
BRICK 3 Br., 1% bath, 2 living area, patio. E12 

LARGE LOT, 3 bdr., 1 b., frame, lots of extras. E13 
TASTEFULLY REMODELED 4 bdr. 3 bath, extras. E14 
NICE FRAME 3 bdr., 11/2  ba. CA, Storage, Big yara. LID 

NICE OLDER-2 bdr., cent. WA, new kitchen. E17 
BEGINNING UNIQUE 11/2  story rock in Oakhollow. E18 
ENERGY EFFICIENT new metal frame 2 bdr. home. 
NEW HOMES UNDER CONSTRUCTION, Call for details. 
CLOSE TO SCHOOLS, 3 bdr., 1% bth, extra nice house. 
E20 
PRICED RIGHT, 2 bdr., 1 bth, inside repainted. E21 
BRICK 3 bdr., 11/2  ba., Will trade for Lake Leon. E22 

1g1)1L 
COUldrest 

allef _ REAL ESTATE_ 

BARBARA LOVE, INC. 	80 EAST 

E+R.* EN 
	 EASTLAND TEXAS 76448 

GORMAN 
MOBILE HOME, 3 lots, 3 bdr., 2 bath. G1 
ROCK HOME, over 1 ac. lot. G3 
EQUITY BUY-3 bdr., patio and storage building. G8 

gloving to Eastland County? or anywhere in U.S.A. Call 
Toll Free 1-800-525-8910 Ext. 4365 for information. (No 
Rentals Please) 

OTHER 
RANGER, Large 2 bdr., cellar, corner lot, nice. 01 
11/2  STORY LAKE HOUSE, 3 bdr., 3 baths, leased lot. 02 
CISCO, 3 bdr., 1 bath on 1 Ac. Greenhouse, trees. 03 
RISING STAR, 1900's home needs TLC, on 8 Ac. 05 
LAKE LEON, 2 bdr. t. sow 3 deeded lots. Boat hse. 06 
LAKE LEON, 3 bdr., 2 baths, on 2 deeded lots. 0? 

HOUSE AND ACREAGE 
OWNER FINANCED- 2 sotn n 11/2  Ac.-Eastland HAI 

71/2  ACRES, 2 bdr. home, bunkhouse and barns. HAS 
5 AC., 2 bdr., 1 bath home in Olden. HA6 

CROSS PLAINS,110 ac., custom brick home. HAll 
CISCO, 4 bdr., 21/2  bath home on 10 acres. HA15 

ACREAGE 

428 ACRES So. of Cisco, tsar, iunting, minerals. Al 
.725 AC. So. access of 1-20, near 2 exits. A2 
1.2 ACRES, city water, excellent homesites. A3 
SMALL tracts So. of Eastland, building sites. A4 
78 ACRES, Necessil:y Comm., 2 tanks, some minerals. A6 
121/2  AC. Near Lake Leon on pavement, staff water. A7 
60 ACRES, NW of C'isco, Rd. frontage on 2 sides. A8 
1671/2  AC. 70 Ac. field, rest pasture, tanks, well. A14 
30.87 AC. on FM571 SE of Lake Leon, trees, minerals. Al5 
RISING STAR, 8 ac., w/older home, owner carry. A17 

COMMERCIAL 
OFFICE BLDG. on Seaman, owner carry. Cl 
4-PLEX APTS. 2 bdr., 1 or 11/2  baths. FHA. C2 
3 RENTALS, large lots, fenced, garage. C3 
OFFICE BLDG., 2 lots on Commerce St. C4 
HWY 80 E. near 1-20, large bldg. 4'2 ac. C5 
PRICE REDUCED-Office or Retail, Main Street. C6 
BRECKENRIDGE, bldg. & older station on 21/2  lots. C7 
N. SEAMAN, stucco bldg., 3 blks. from square. C8 
GORMAN-Hwy. 6 Frontage-Cafe & Metal Building. C9 

PtioliYE SWAFFORD 
	

HAZEL UNDERWOOD 
	

BARBARA LOVE 
	

ROGER AUTREY 
	

ELMER FOSTER 
447.1050 	 629-1188 

	
647-1397 
	

442-3345 
	

629-1972 
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—Open Now 
Cisco Office Supply Inc. 
805 Conrad Hilton 	1817) 442-4183 

Cash Buyers 

Save 15% Thru July 

Watch For Grand Opening Soon 

Majestic Theatre 
Eastland 629-1220 

One Showing Only Each Evening 

Open 7:30 Show Starts At 7:50 P.M. 

Starts Friday 

BURT 
REYNOLDS 

is 

Ranger Drive-In 
Ranger 647-3802 Theatre 

Starts Friday 

Universal Pictures and Warner Bros. Present A WALTER WOOD Production 
A HAL NEEDHAM Film BURT REYNOLDS .:"STROKER ACE" NED BEATTY 

JIM NABORS PARKER STEVENSON and LONI ANDERSONF;mx. 
Screenplay by HUGH WILSON and HAL NEEDHAM Music by AL CAPPS 

Produced  by HANK MOONJEAN Directed by HAL NEEDHAM  
	 litleSorgtroilleCHARtIE WilaS BAD 	  

KUM ••••3••• Olv 	•OrAw.J. 	0.1.13••• 

1T'S 22 YEARS LATER, 

D NORMAN BATES 

IS COMING HOME. 

11 0 

PLUS 
Fri, Sat, & Sun 

Win Oklaunion 
Power Station Under 
Construction 

The Rev. H.S. Hen-
son, retired Baptist 
minister, officiated. 
Burial was at Mer-
rimam Cemetery near 
Ranger. 

Born March 21, 1902, 
in Gatesville, she mar-
ried Joe Fox Aug. 23, 
1927, in Ozona. She was 
a housewife and a 
Methodist. 

Survivors include 
her husband; a son, 
Jack Edwards of Vic 
toria; three grand-
children; three great-
grandchildren; and 
several nieces and 
nephews. 

W.D. (Dean) 
Broughton 

BIG SPRING—W.D. 
"Slim" Broughton, 57, 
of Big Spring, died Fri-
day in Ingram after a 
sudden illness. Ser-
vices were at 4 p.m. 
Monday at Nalley-
Pickle Funeral Home. 

Burial was at Trinity 
Memorial Park. 

Survivors include his 
wife; two sons, Bruce  

of Odessa and Bryan of 
San Antonio; a sister, 
Opal Majors of Fort 
Worth; and a brother, 
E.C. of Torrance, 
Calif. 

Dean was the son of 
Oscar and Ella 
(Haynes) Broughton. 
He was born in Rising 
Star and graduated 
from Rising Star High 
School. 

Personals 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Seago of Midland and 
son, Eddie Seago of 
Houston, 	were 
weekend visitors of 
Mr. and Mrs. J.N. 
(Punkin) Childers. Ed 
was en-route to 
Houston where he ex-
pects to undergo 
surgery. 

Celebrate 
Life! 

Help the 

March of Dimes 
Fight 

Birth Defects 

The estimated cost 
of West Texas Utilities 
Co.'s Oklaunion Power 
Station, now under 
construction in North 
Texas, has been reduc-
ed by $127 million. 

The announcement 
was made Friday by 
Durwood Chalker of 
Dallas, chairman and 
chief executive officer 
of Central and South 
West Corp., WTU's 
parent company, at a 
presentation before the 
Utility and Tele-
communications 
Securities Club of 
Chicago. 

The reduced cost 
estimate 	results 
primarily from being 
able to negotiate better 
contracts in today's 
market with manufac-
turers and suppliers 
for practically all of 
the equipment needed 
for Oklaunion, Chalker 
said. The cost had been 
estimated at $525 
million a year ago, but 
now is estimated at 
$398 million. 

The Oklaunion 
Power Station will 
have a net generating 
capacity of 640 
megawatts and will be 
the first power plant in 
WTU's system to bum 
coal as a boiler fuel. 
The plant is scheduled 
for completion in 
December 1986 and 
will be in full operation 
before the summer of 
1987. 

It will be owned 
jointly by WTU and 
two other CSW sub-
sidiaries, Public Ser- 

vice Co. of Oklahoma 
and Central Power and 
Light Co. WTU will 
own 55 % of the plant 
and will be the 
operating partner. 

REPORT OIL FIELD THIEVES 

1.800-01L-COPS 
TOLL FREE • REWARD 

Mrs. Alta Mae 
Tucker, twin sister of 
Alton Burns, plans to 
make Rising Star her 
home in the near 
future. 

She's returning to 
Fort Worth temporari-
ly and will make a trip 
from there to Lubbock 
with her daughter's 

Saturday, Aug. 6th 
will be the 63rd annual 
ex-student 	and 
teachers reunion for 
Pioneer, Liberty, 
Sabanno, Cook, Curtis, 
Hickman, Gunn, Peak 
and Crocker schools. 

The reunion will be 
held under the old 
Pioneer Community 
tabernacle at Pioneer. 
In case of bad weather 

family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Morrison, 
Michael and Michelle 
and granddaughter, 
Kim Tucker, all of Fort 
Worth. 

While in Lubbock 
Mrs. Tucker will meet 
her grandson, David 
Ross Tucker, who is 
stationed at the air  

it will be moved to the 
Pioneer Community 
club 	building. 
Registration will begin 
at 9:00 a.m. The noon 
meal will be catered by 
ex-student of Pioneer, 
Bill Hester and wife, 
Lucille, owners of the 
Colony Restaurant in 
Cisco. Price is $3.00 
per plate. 

base in Clovis, N.M. 
She will get to see her 
new great-grandson 
for the first time. 

Mrs. 	Tucker's 
youngest son and his 
family, Rob and 
Shirley Tucker, Bobbi, 
Stacy and Ashley, live 
in Lubbock. 

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 1983 

Pioneer School 
Reunion To Be Held 

Clean-Up Week, August 1-6 

Sister of Alton Burns Plans To Make 
Rising Star Her Future Home 



Rising Stall 
Nursing Center 

Avis Massey 
'Activity Director 
	;  »_ 
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CAN LIVE WITH,/  

Touch Call Service. 
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II  I r.Gary Harris 
D.D.S. 

Announces The Opening Of His 

Office Of General dentistry 

Former Location Of Dr.Robert F.Blockstock 

Office Hours 9 to 5 Mon. thru Fri. 

602 Ave E. 
Cisco 442-1166 
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Pioneer News 
By Mabel Halsell 

mins, 
••=1. 

We hear so much 
about the education 
crisis. First we look at 
the indicators of this 
crises. Poor perfor-
mance in the three 
basic skills is what we 
hear most about. 
(There are others). 
Some disintegrating 
influences have caused 
this poor performance 
in two of these fields; 
the reading and 
writing abilities of 
some students in High 
School and in college. 
One example, more 
than half the entering 
Freshmen in Uni. of 
California, Berkley, 
are required to take 
remedial courses in 
Reading and writing 

aue to their inade- 
"uacies in these fields. 

Many more examples 
can be cited. 

Three deterrents to 
proficiency in reading 
and writing are cited 

mir - dm. 
MID 	on. 
MM. =a. Animw •I= ••.me,  

'Num. 

here. Excessive view-
ing of television, Ob-
jective tests in all 
school levels, and 
Audio-visual equip-
ment. 
Some of the 

arguments for blaming 
T.V. are, it shortens 
the attention span in 
reading; limits the 
mental work of the 
viewer and may cause 
the viewer to cease to 
think. 

Too much use of 
Audio-Visual equip-
ment in the classroom 
discourages the use of 
books; school books, 
books for entertain-
ment and books as 
sources for research. 

The devastating in-
fluence of objective 
tests, introduced into 
our secondary schools 
when universities 
abandoned the essay 
type entrance ex-
aminations, is cause  

for complaints. 
These are only a few 

of the many deterrents 
that teachers and more 
taxes cannot correct. 

Two people have 
called in news. Thank 
you! 

Alma Morris reports 
the illness of her sister, 
Josie and her 
residence in General 
Hospital, Coleman. 
Her room number is 
111. We wish her a 
speedy recovery. Their 
visitors this week were 
Mrs. Melba Cathy and 
Mrs. Sylvia Brown. 

Mrs. Nora Phillips 
had extensive damage 
to her house and 
premises from the hail 
which came June 28. 
Little damage can be 
seen after sixteen of 
her children and 
grandchildren came on 
the weekend following 
the hail. Her daughter, 
Nancy and husband 
Thomas Wolf of 
Midland, came earlier 
in the week. Thomas 
raked leaves and 
weeds and carried off 

At this time, 
offer available 
only in: Cross Plains  

limbs. Nancy painted 
the living room. Son 
Bob and wife, Mildred, 
their sons, Kenneth 
and a friend, Shelly 
and Michael and friend 
Kelly, pam and Bill 
Marshall of Midland, 
James and Wanda 
Cloud of Early came 
on Saturday. They 
brought 	fresh 
tomatoes and he work-
ed on her stove. Others 
were Howard, Allen 
and Janice and Glenda 
Phillips. When they 
went home, her house 
was re-roofed and the 
yard was clean. 

Visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Sessums 
were David and 
Rachel Witherspoon of 
Lancaster, Ruth and 
Henry Roe of Lubbock, 
Lottie Sooter and Nell 
Fleming of the com-
munity. 

Visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Fleming were 
Betty Merion, Billy 
Freeman and Jim and 
Charlene of the com-
munity, Julia Floyd, 
Brady, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Watson and sons, 
Billy and Alton of 
Pampa, Jerry and 
Jimmy Fleming of 
McLean, Joe Fleming 
of Abilene and Rev. 
Doom of Baird. 

Mrs. 	Brown's 
visitors were Mrs. 
Hazel Marsh of Cross 
Plains, Mrs. Elsie 
Byrd, Cross Cut, 
Velma Brown, Lou 
Grider, and Mrs. 
Halsell and daughter, 
Lou Rodenberger of 
Abilene, Mrs. Jack 
White and grand-
daughter, Jennifer 
Pell of Bakersfiels, Ca. 

Velma Brown visited 
her sister, Donnie 
Johnson in Rising Star 
recently and Opal 
Dean on Wednesday. 
She also visited Mrs. 
Carol Westerman and 
Bea Jones, who were 
guests of Mrs. Opal 
Dean. 

,Gail Flippin visited 
in Brownwood on 
Thursday. 	Her 
children, Tamara and 
Tye returned home 
with her after visiting 
there for several days. 

Recent visitors with 
Mr. and Mrs. Halsell 
were Lou and Charles 
Rodrnberger 	of 
Abilene, Onis and 
David Taylor, and 
Rev. John Swift. 
Mrs Halsell visited 
Mrs. Cora Carpenter 
and other friends in 
Woodson, recently. 	, 

Recent visitors with 
Mr. and Mrs. W.G. 
Parrish were Mr. and 
Mrs. Alvin Parrish, 
Stephen, Mark and 
Ryan of El Paso, 
Kathy Cannon of Nen-
nikah, Okla., Robert 
Thompson and Gor-
mond Parrish of Cross 
Plains, Michael In-
gram of Cross Plains, 
Louise Tucker and 
Tina Graham of 
Abilene, Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Williams of 
Mesqquite, who at-
tended church with 
them Sunday, Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Rice, Clyde, 
and Rev. and Mrs. E.J. 
Hierholzer of Pioneer. 
They enjoyed an even-
ing of music and sing-
ing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Par-
rish attended the wed-
ding of their grandson, 
Carl Rice, in Abilene 
on Saturday. 

Please call Mrs. Betty 
Beggs telephone 
725-7235 for your next 

news. 

JULY 31 
Judith Kinsey 
Valera Phillips 

AUGUST 1 
None 

AUGUST 2 
R.T. Ezzell 
Marissa Polk 

AUGUST 3 
Gary Dennard 
Merlinda Munguia 
Nell Garner 

AUGUST 4 
Le Nell Henry 
Eunice Smith 

AUGUST 5 
Lolene Claborn 
Donna Brown Grider 
Rebecca Owen 

AUGUST 6 
Mrs. Arbie Burcham 
Lillian Taylor 
Melody Fisher 

Monday, 7-18, Bingo 
at 10:00. A.D. calling 
numbers. Martha Irby 
and Ada Foster won 
three games each. 
Mary Crisp and Ora 
Clark won two each 
and Maggie Christian 
and Estell Bolding won 
one game each. 
Tuesday, 19, Birthday 

party at 2:30-Today we 
honor Carl Burns, born 
7-4-1898, Leon Co. Tex; 
Charity White, born 
7-17-1898 in Brown Co. 
Tx.; and Charles 
(Buster) Rixford, born 
7-30-1907 	in 
Shinglehouse, Pa. 

The entertainment 
was furnished by Clif-
fogene Witt at piano, 
Elizabeth Robertson, 
Bertha Mae White and 
Ruby Murdoch sing-
ing, and our faithful 
volunteers with their 
delicious cakes and 
punch. Serving punch 
was Viola Burcham, 
Jean Ogden, Irene 
Starkey,Sula Harris, 
Artie Jaggers, Stella 
Hill, Vera Hill, Inez 
Robertson and Lolene 
Claborn. 

Thank all of you for 
making it such a nice 
Birthday party. 

Wednesday, 20-We 
welcomed Susie Seals 
back from the hospital. 
9:30-The ones in wheel 
chairs that wanted to 
go out were pushed out 
to see the flowers, 
birds and trees while it 
was cool. 
At 4:15 Dorothy 
Reynolds and Ruby 
McCowen came and 
played piano and led 
songs for us. 
The Bible Study at 7:00 
was led by Bro. Lewis 
Wilkerson. There was 
a good crowd for both 
services. 

Thursday,21- Some 
residents wanted to be 
pushed outside again. 
Plans are being made 
to have children and 
young people come 
Sunday, July 31 at 2:00 
to "Adopt A Grand-
parent." 

Friday 22- 10:00 
writing. 
At 2:00 Bible Study will 
be led by Olive Odom 
and Lois Richardson. 
We want to especially 
thank Ruby Murdoch 
for leading singing 
while 	Robert 
Sparkman is ill and 
Cliffogene Witt for 
playing the piano while 
Bea Kelton is on an 
over seas tour. Ann 
Adkins played Friday 
in Cliffgene's place. 
Ruby and Cliffogene 
are both from First 
Baptist Church of Ris-
ing Star. Thanks to 
everyone that helps to 
make life more plea-
sant for our residents. 

Saturday 23. 
Sunday 24- 3:00 

church service was led 
by Nick Sublet from 
Church of Christ. A 
group accompanied 
him to help with the 
singing. 

Mr. Barnes brought 
egg plant and bell 
peppers--We thank 
everyone that brought 
fresh vegetables from 
your garden to share 
with us. Sorry I have 
missed you if I have. 

Again we want to ex-
tend an invitation to 
parents, G.A. leaders, 
Sunday 	school 
teachers or anyone 
working with children 
to bring them Sunday 
at 2:00 so they can 
"Adopt A Grand-
parent" and bring joy 
to both. 

Visitors this week 
who signed the 
register: Detta and 
George Webb, Ivy 
Allen,Last week Mar-
tha Irby was visited by 
Frances Brown Colson 
of Denver, Colo. Sorry 
I failed to get it in the 
paper last week; 
Woodrow Harris, J.W. 
Starkey, Edra Butler, 
Ray Hutchinson, Dar-
rold and Lois Chalk, 
Gari Sue Maynard, 
Shelly Wells, Brenda 
Wells, Mary and Jamie 
Paden of Trent, Theo 
and Opal Boyd, Dean 
and Jeannine Bailey, 
Stella Hill, Rada King, 
Mary Carroll, Sula 
Harris, La Verne Car-
roll, Eleanor Nunnally, 
Jackie, Brenda and 
Stephanie Jowers, and 
Opal Hill. 

The May Senior 
Citizens got off to a 
booming start last 
Tuesday night on their 
first quilting party. 
Quilting parties are to 
be held each Tuesday 
night beginning at 6 
p.m. Refreshments or 
covered dish foods for 
snacking or eating will 
be whatever you care 
to bring. There will be 
domino games of your 
choice if you do not 
quilt. Each guest will 
pay fifty cents gate fee 
plus any donations. 

One quilt was com-
pleted last Tuesday 
night and two quilts 
will be set up for 
quilting next week. 
The Senior Citizens 
wich to express their 
appreciation for all the 
quilts we have booked 
ahead. 

I have recently 
returned from a 
delightful vacation in 
Austin, Indiana. I 
spent 10 days with Pol-
ly Campbell, who 
many of you met 
several years ago 
while she was here 
visiting with me and 
my family. Also I 
visited in the homes of 
Willie and Margaret 
Howard, Mr. and Mrs. 
Boyd Howard, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Messer. 

We had a back yard 
picnic at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Messer on July 4, as we 
all decided to stay off 
the highways during 
the heavy traffic time. 
I visited several other 
friends and relatives in 
the area while I was 
there including Leon 
and Bertha Campbell 
and Darrell Ray Brock 
and his son. 

Entha Campbell 

Horace White had 
extensive tests in a 
veteran hospital last 
week. He was visited 
by his cousins, Alma 
Martin and in-laws 
Viola Jackson and 
Faye Wheeler last 
Thursday. 

I am considering an 
invitation to spend the 
witer months, beginn-
ing about Oct. 1, with 
friends just South of 
Three Rivers, Texas. 
They claim it is a very 
pleasant climate there. 

Robert Sparkrnen re-
mains in Carswell AFB 
hospital. 

Mrs. Jean Key of 
Freeport died in 
pickup accident early 
Sunday. She was the 
daughter-in-law of 
Mrs. Bill Key of Rising 
Star. 

Frank Madison is 
improving some since 
a mild stroke last 
week. He is in the 
Brownwood Regional 
Hospital. 

Mary Dovers is im-
proving in the 
Brownwood Regional 
Hospital since a heart 
attack last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
Jordan, Tammy, Lisa 
and Gerald of Potosi; 
and Matt Crooks of 
Lubbock visited their 
grandmother, Mrs. 
Ima Croaks, last Sun-
day. 

The fifth Sunday ser-
vices will be sponsored 
by First Baptist 
Church. The morning 
preaching hour will be 
conducted in the local 
tabernacle. A covered 
dish meal will be serv-
ed at the noon hour and 
will be followed by an 
afternoon singing. 

302 Chestnut 
Baird, Texas 79504 

(915) 854-1555 

• Have you heard about our Soft Touch sale? 

• We're even waiving our charge to connect 
your access line to Touch Call service ... 

• And during the sale you'll save at least $35. 

• So order your Touch Call while we're the 
Soft Touch. 

• At the same time ask how you can streamline your 
current service with a free modular conversion kit. 

• Call your nearest Continental business office now. 

oink- MI - Continental Telephone 
of Texas 

THURSDAY, JULY ZS, 1983 
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May News 

COMANCHE COUNTY 
ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE 

ANNUAL 
MEMBERSHIP 

MEETING 
AUGUST 12, 1983 

8:00 P.M. 

COMANCHE HIGH SCHOOL 
FOOTBALL STADIUM 
IN COMANCHE 

(Hwy. 16 North) 

Registration Gifts-Refreshments-Door Prizes 

REGISTRATION BEGINS AT 7:00 P.M.-10 
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Sale Starts August 1 

There 1, no need 
tor you to assign 
your Pat 
certificates to buy 
a new farm tractor 
now Not if you take advantage of 
special end-of-model offers on Jonn 
Deere 40 Series Tractor 

Between June cam re:ores up to 
53.200 {see chart] and your trade-in. 
you'll likely cover downpayment Tnen 
if you're a qualified buyer and finance 
won Jonn Deere. loance charges will 
be waived to March I. 1984 Or you 
can take an additional (ash rebate in 
lieu of wander up to 51.400.' But you 

is! act during June 
to take advantage 

of offers at this 
level 

One Other 
reminder Were 

discounting from 
tractor list prices that date back to 1981 
on the 40 Series 

So get the new 40 Series tractor you 
need now Out hold onto PIK certificates 
and still get a new tractor for Investment 
Tax Credit plus firy-year depreciation 
to help shield income sri 1983 

Come on in soon. Were ready and 
willing to deal on the new tractor of 
your choice 

June "83 Cash 
Cash Rebate 
	

Rebate In Lieu 	MasIrnum 
Model 
	

on Purchase 
	

of Walter 	 Rebate 

228-np 8640 
179-hp 8440 
180-np 4840 
I 55-hp 4640 
I 30-np 4440 
110-hp 4240 
90-rip 4040 
80-hp 2940 
70-np 2640 
60-hp 2440 
50-hp 2240 
40-np 2040 

	

53.200 	 SI 400 

	

3.000 	 1.100 

	

2.700 	 1,020 

	

2.300 	 900 

	

1.700 	 700 

	

1.500 	 600 

	

600 	 550 

	

1,400 	 400 

	

900 	 350 

	

400 	 300 

	

100 	 250 

	

100 	 200 
(Offer subject to tractor availabartyl 

14.600 
4.100 
3.700 
3.200 
2.400 
2.100 
1.150 
1.800 
1.250 

700 
350 
300 

•...Luarrum ;mates on .0 Sees 1,4.101 	 (0, w, ruv low 1,1, 	v..11 	(Tv, In.,.d 

,inch iorocrovia a,  vein 
be ,kocro 	 A AM1 I Am' 

EMMETT 1 - I EXENT. INC. 

	

Ildsig haz, is IUP 	 17/643-4311 
Ma* Gomy 	-1 	 Gary Rarbisos 
Eons 1117443.1.1111 	4000 	 Home 817/445-3217 

Or 

1  643-3077 

The Rising Star 
Junior High twirlers 
have completed four 
days of twirling in-
struction with Rozelyn 
Love of Clark Twirling 
Academy in Abilene. 

The two girls learned 
a dance, flag, march 
and lighted baton 
routine along with 
mastering fundamen-
tals of twirl. 

DID YOU KNOW THAT 
- The U.S. spends as 
much money on mari-
juana - $55 Billion a year 
- as is spent on imported 
oil? 

Lori and Stephanie 
also 	attended 
Southwest Drill Team 
camp at Hardin Sim-
mons University in 
Abilene this summer. 
The girls brought 
home four new 
routines for the drill 
team and two superior 
ribbons and an 
honorable mention. 

Lori and Stephanie 
are looking forward to 
working with the Kit-
ten Drill Team and 
hope this fall's Jr. High 
half time entertain-
ment will be fun for 
everyone! 

Junior High Twirlers 
Complete Instruction 

Rising Star 
t 

Goldston's 
Satellite Antennas 

For Performance And 
Dependablility Ton Can't Ray 

More For Less. 

643-2363'1' 	N. Main 

React Car Wash 
The React Ambulance Service will 
host a car wash on August 6, 
starting at 9 a.m. It will be held 

at Joyce Texaco. 

Cars:$5 Trucks & Vans: $750  

*Ammaic 6ongs 

F e"(1 )Tri 
End-of-model rebates up to S4,600 
and a finance waiver offer to 
March 1, 1984 on new 40-to 228-hp 
John Deere 40 Series Tractors 

Stephanie Long, Rezlyn Love, Lori Justice 

SIPE SPRIN 

NEWS 

Southern Savings: 

nous 
Makin 

a better 

Just because your family is 
increasing in size doesn't mean 
that you have to leave the house 
you love! Simply make your 
house a better home with a Home 
Improvement Loan from 
Southern Savings! 
The Option: Move out or 
move up 

More than likely, you've put 
many hours of love and labor into 
your present home. That's why 
the people at Southern Savings 
offer you the option of a Home 
Improvement Loan because they 
know that moving up doesn't 
necessarily mean moving out! 

The Answer: Home 
Improvement the Southern way 

A Southern Home 
Improvement Loan is designed to 
help you with any type of home 
renovation, whether it be 
painting, carpeting, building or 
redecorating. It's easy to get, easy 
to pay back and easy to live with 
because it fits your needs and 
your budget. 

Visit Southern Savings today 
and see how a Southern Home 
Improvement Loan can make 
your house a better home with 
payment terms that won't dig 
into your budget. 

$outklarn 
Member FSLIC 

ings 
Cross Plains Branch, 200 N. Highway 36, 
725-7724 

Home Office: 501 Center, 646-4561, Brownwood 

Branches: Bangs, Brady, Coleman, Comanche, Cross Plains, 
DeLeon, Goldrhwaite, Lampasas, Stephenville 

• • 
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Carl and Kelly Van-
natta of DeLeon and 
Mr. and Mrs. Horas 
Cox of Brownwood 
visited Mr. & Mrs. 
John McKeehan. 

Edward Millwee and 
Sidney Griggs visited 
Mrs. Pat Leslie in 
DeLeon. 

Bobbie Lee Sledge of 
DeLeon spent the 
weekend with Stacy 
Jones. 

Mr. & Mrs. James 
McKeehan and family 
of Abilene visited his 
folks Mr. & Mrs. Q.W. 
McKeehan. 

Mr. & Mrs. John 
McKeehan visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Buck Westen 
at Carbon Sunday. 

Mrs. Dorothy Robin-
son and Joyce Burk of 
Comanche visited their 
sister, Mrs. Ruby 
Wyatt. 

Mrs. Nona Leonard 
of Missouri and Mrs. 
Candy Nell and Misty 
Leonard of Ft. Worth 
and George Leonard of 
Rising Star visited Mr. 
& Mrs. N.L. Leonard 
this week. 

Cindy Otwell and 
Judy Leslie of DeLeon 
visited Margaret 
Millwee over the 
weekend. 

Everyone in Sipe is 
busy getting ready for 
the homecoming this 
weekend, Sunday the 
31st. 

West Texas 
Fair & Rodeo 
Shapes Up 

The parade commit-
tee for the West Texas 
Fair & Rodeo is 
already 	putting 
together plans for this 
year's parade to be 
held 	Saturday, 
September 17th. The 
route and line-up pro-
cedure has been 
modified slightly this 
year to eliminate pro-
blems from years past. 

All persons and 
groups planning to par-
ticipate in this year's 
West Texas Fair & 
Rodeo should request 
entry forms by 
writing, Parade, P.O. 
Box 5527, Abilene, 
Texas 79608. Entries 
must be returned to the 
committee 	by 
September 7th when it 
will finalize the parade 
line-up. 	Position 
numbers and maps 
will then be sent back 
to entrants. Late en-
tries will be placed at 
the end of the parade. 

Entries will be given 
numbers correspon-
ding to numbered 
stakes along Cypress 
north of the Abilene 
Civic Center parking 
lot to enable them to 
get into position prior 
to the parade. Bands 
will assemble on the 
Civic Center parking 
lot and feed into the 
parade from there. 

The parade will 
begin promptly at 10 
a.m. at North 7th and 
Pine, moving south to 
North First and west to 
Hickory, then north to 
North Eight and east 
on 8th where the 
parade will disperse. 
Trophies will be 
awarded to first and 
second place bands in 
each division and two 
places will be awarded 
to the best overall units 
in the parade. 

*
v******************************* **************1 

* 
STAR * PLAZA i 

. Restaurant 	 3 3 	 5 * * * * Highway 36 West  

For The Best Chicken Fry, Hamburger : * 
* : 
* * 
* Steak or Hamburgers In 73 Miles. 	1 

4,-*  * * 
* * . _ Aiill ' 

* * *. 
I 	

* 	 *  * 	* 
. 	

*
E 	* 6*  *: • * CAN BE • • • . • 

il 	 'I 

•Or  

4C 	. 	 6434960 1  .z 
*********************I******************** 

• • • • HAIL Damage Sale 
	 -7, 

i We Have Several Cars And Pickups With 
Slight Hail Damage And Large Discounts. 

i LTD 4 .Door 
r 0 	Was $10,967 
0 	Disc. 800 
;Ball Damage 440 

Mustang. CT 
Was $11.679 

Dbc. 300 
Hail damage 360 

r 
Thunderbird Demo: 

	

Was $12,550 	0 

	

Disc. 1,250 	0 

	

Hail damage 360 	$ 
/Now $9727 • Now $10,519 Now $10,94(N 
• Future 2 Door 

Coupe 
% 	Was $9.521 
0 	Disc. 800 
0 Hall Damao 465 

Bronco II 
Was $11,608 

Dbc . 800 
Hall Damage 392 

Now 

F100 

11aiiltamM 

Pickup 	) 
No. 7767 

Was $8.026 
Dbc. 800 

114_ NOW $10,416 

Now $8,256 
, 

$6912 
• F100 Pickup 
0 
0 	No. 5512 I

Was $10,707 
0 	Dbc. 800 

lialtd_amage 304_ 

iNow $9603 

F 150 
No. 3396 

Was 
Disc. 

Hail Damage 

Pickup 

9659 
800 
401 

F150 

Now 
Hail Damage 

Pickup 
No. 3397 
Was $9,659 

Dbe. 800 
292 

Now $8448 $8567 
,0 

F 150 Explorer $ 
0 Pickup No. 6826 0 Imo 	w 	1111,032 

Dbc. 800 
ova Damage 377 491_ 

F150 Demo 
No. 3248 

Was 1110,845 
Dbc. 1250 

Hall 326 

F250 4X4 	0 
No. 4545 	0 

0 
Was 1111,507 	

0 Dbc. 800 
Hail damage 	0 

;Now $9855 4  Now $9269 Now —0 
$10,216 
....----.0  
F700 Truck 

Was $27,363 40 
Dbc. 2,560 ; 

Damage_1112_0 

P 
0 F250 424 
: No. 0367 
iwai, $12,572 
0 	Disc. 800 

40° ...111 1̀1, .11: 

F250 Super 
Cab No. 5241 

Was $14,188 
Disc. 800 

Damage 454 

F250 Diesel 
Was $15.243 

Dbc. 
Dames. 

$14,055 

800 
388 

0 $24,020°  • • 311,A061, • $12,934 

JOHNSTON  JRUCK & SUPPLY, INC 
Box 638 817-725-6181 Cross Plains, Texas 76443 
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