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County Commissioners 
Discuss EMS and Many 
Other Important Items 

Catching Up on 
Star Pride News 

Freedom Festival, 
Rodeo Big Success 

Rising Star and Sipe Springs Volunteer Fire Departments and 
Rising Star Volunteer Ambulances added color to the parade. 

Your Chamber of Com-
merce & Agriculture 
would like to say a big 
thanks to each and every 
one who helped in any way 
with this year's 4th ofJuly 
Freedom Festival and for 
making it the success it 
was! Each and every as-
pect of the Freedom Fes-
tival was a result of a lot 
of people working to make 
it happen and many long 
hours of hard work. 
Thank you! 

The Junior Rodeo spon-
sored by the Chamber of 
Commerce & Agriculture 
and the Rising Star Rop-
ing Club was produced by 
the 4S Rodeo Club of 
Goldthwaite. Due to the 

multitude of workers in 
all areas, there is no pos-
sible way to name them 
all, you know who you are! 
And we want you to know 
how very much we appre-
ciate your help. Many 
thanks! 

Winners in the parade 
in downtown Rising Star 
during the July Fourth 
Freedom Festival were: 

Motorcycle division: 1. 
Clarence and Nelda Evett 
of Comanche; 2. Cross 
Timbers Wind Riders with 
Texas flag, Paul Brownlee 
of De Leon; 3.Dick Trout-
man of Gorman, Cross.  
Timbers Wind Riders. 

Horse and Wagon divi- 

son: 1. Steve Hill], D&D 
Cattle Co. of Old Glory; 2. 
Hill Chuck Wagon of Ris-
ing Star with Weldon and 
Arla Hill aboard; 3. Ris-
ing Star 4-H with Amy 
Agnew, Blair Bailey, 
Holly Butler and Bridgett 
Claborn. 

Bicycle Riders division: 
1. Allison Agnew; 2.Lind-
sey Herring; 3. Derric 
Graves. 

Antique Cars: James T. 
Wright of Eastland, '29 
Model A Ford Roaster; 2. 
Floyd Caraway of Ranger, 
'36 Ford convertible; 3. 
Roy Barnhill of Ranger, 

-'23 Model T Ford. _  
Float: 1. Gorman Ch am- 
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were also on the Agenda. 
There were budget re-
quests and various reports 
on county affairs. 

Sitting in the Court for 
Pct. 3 Commissioner L.T. 
Owen was Quintin Wright 
of Groman, Mr. Owen's 
foreman. Owen, who had 
heart by-pass surgery last 
week, was reported to be 
improving rapidly at an 
Abilene hospital. `He is 
getting so restless you 
can'tfind him in his room,' 
one visitor said. 

County Judge Scott 
Bailey said he would like 
to wait on budget hear-
ings until Owen is back ac, 
his post in the Court. The 
next fiscal year begins 
Oct. 1. 

The Commissioners re-
appointed Saul Pullman, 
Eastland attorney, as a 
Board member for the 
Central Texas MHMR 
Center. 

Also appointed were a 
number of election judges 
to serve August 10 in vot-
ing Precincts of the 
county. These names will 
be published in the local 
newspapers. 

Commissioner of Pre-
cinct 4 Reggie Pittman 
reported that last 
Saturday's auction at 
Cisco of surplus items 
brought in about $10,000. 
The Commissioners who 
attended said that the 
crowd was not very large -
but that the people who 
did come really meant 
business. Items ranging 
from county equipment to 
outmodeled typewriters 
were sold. 

On another matter, 
Pittman reported that 19 
prisoners were currently 
in the County Jail. This 
included one for another 
county, six for TDC, two 
on 'Blue' warrants, nine 
being held on pre-trial, 
and one inmate from the 
city. 

Pct. 2 Commissioner 
Calvin Ainsworth re-
ported to the Court that 

The Eastland County Antique Car Club entries draw the crowd's 
interest each year they enter the parade at Rising Star. 

said it might be possible 
to work out Emergency 
Medical Services with 
surrounding towns, with 
some arrangement where 
Cisco and Ranger Ambu-
lances could cover 
Eastland. 

Robinson said that 
County and Eastland City 
Commissioners are in-
vited to a meeting at 
Eastland Memorial Hos-
pital at 10:30 a.m. July 
19. The Emergency Medi-
cal situation is expected 
to be reviewed at that 
time. Robinson said he 
planned to attend, but did 
not indicate much hope of 
a solution. 

The proposed Ambu-
lance Service budget 
submitted by Eastland 
Hospital to the Commis-
sioners estimated total 
expenses for 1991-92 as 
$123,203 and collections 
at $109,754, showing a 
loss of $13,449. 

The budget also esti-
mated calls at 2.2 per day, 
66.9 per month, and 803 
annually. The estimated 
charge per call would be 
$201. 

On a related subject, 
County Judge Scott 
Bailey reported that some 
petitions calling for an 
election for a county-wide 
Ambulance Service Tax-
ing District had come into 
his office. 

But there are only 65 
verifiable signatures so 
far, the Judge said, and it 
takes 200. There are other 
petitions out circulating, 
but they have not been 
turned in early enough to 
meet the deadline for the 
August 10 election. 

The Commissioners 
were told that the next 
possible date citizens 
could vote on whether to 
subsidize the Ambulance 
Service with taxes will be 
in November. 

Although County Com-
missioners spent much of 
their time Monday dis-
cussing Emergency Medi-
cal Services, a number of 
other important topics Continued Inside 

final Day Is TODAY 

Register to Vote in Aug. 10 Election 

Thank You name due to marriage - or 
new residents not regis-
tered - all need to go by 
and sign a change form. 

Mrs. Trout reports that 
10,668 voters are now 
registered in Eastland 
County. 

Citizens are reminded 
by Nancy Trout, County 
Tax Collector, to come by 
her office on the First 
Floor of the Courthouse 
and fill out an application 
if they are not registered. 
Or, if they have a change 
of address, change of 

around Butler's Texaco. 
Saturday, July 1, was 

an overall workday. Vol-
unteers from Star Pride, 
the City, Chamber of 
Commerce & Agriculture, 
individuals and organiza-
tions pitched in to do last 
minute clean-up of our 
town. Workers all around 
town include Gene Lyon, 
David Scoville, Sally 
Hutchinson, 	Paul 
Maxwell, Amy West, Be-
linda West, Clarence 
Jones, Steve Harrelson, 
Shelly Bailey, Garry 
Duggan, Mary Ann and 
Billy Paul Underwood, 
Stephen O'Connor, Don 
O'Connor, 	Richard 
O'Connor, Ruby Murdoch, 
Kailani, Zachary, Brett 
and Tonya Killion, James 
Ramsay, Jean Ramsay 
and Bones O'Connor. 

Last minute finishing 
touches in preparing for 
the Rising Star Freedom 
Festival were performed: 
Jeanine Bailey hemmed 
American flags, Rising 
Star Lumber Co. gave 
discounts to Star Pride for 
flag poles and for needed 
paint, the American Le-
gion donated flags to be 
placed in barrels on down-
town sidewalks, Cindy 
Wood's class donated plas-
tic to cover Higginbotham 
windows, Winfrey's Feed 
& Peanut Co. donated 
weed killer to be sprayed 
on weeds growing in 
cracks of sidewalks, Nall's 
Quick Stop gave ice, cups 
and cokes and to the Ris-
ing Star Volunteer Fire 
Department for spraying 
downtown windows. 

Star Pride would like to 
take this opportunity to 
thank each and every 
person responsible for the 
tremendous task of clean-
up of Rising Star. We 
would like to thank land-
owners for permission 
given to Star Pride to do 
the clean-up and for any 
and all donations made to 
Star Pride for our endeav-
ors. All our hard work has 
been well worth the ef-
forts of all, from all the 
compliments we have 
received of how clean and 
beautiful Rising Star 
looked for our 4th ofJuly 
Freedom Festival! 

We can't stop now, 
though. Star Pride's next 
scheduled meeting will be 
Tuesday, July 16, at 7 p.m. 
at the Peoples State Bank. 
You will want to make 
plans to come and see 
what Star Pride has in 
store for Rising Star in 
the future. 

Voters in Eastland 
County must be regis-
tered by Thursday, July 
11 in order to be eligible 
to vote Aug. 10 in the 
important Constitutional 
Amendment Election, as 
well as the new Eastland 
County Education Dis-
trict Election. 

Communttg Catendar 

We would like to say 
"Thank You!" to Faye 
Medley, Judi Butler, and 
Nanette Goldston for all 
the hard work they have 
done cleaning the front 
yard and painting City 
Hall and the side of the 
Police Station. You 
women have put in a lot of 
hard work and a lot of 

your free time. We are 
"really proud" and sin-
cerely appreciate every-
thing you have done! 
Many Thanks! 

Mayor Jerrell D. Bible 
Councilpersons: James 

Cook, Billy Harmon, Edra 
Butler, Randy Goldston, 
Charles Barnes, and all 
city employees. 

5141, by 9:45 a.m. 2ND THURSDAY 
Masonic Lodge, 7:3 

3RD TUESDAY 
Food Commodities dis-
tributed, Senior Citizens 
Center, noon to 1 p.m. 

Physicals Will Be 
Given August 6 

City Thanks 
Star Pride 

EACHTHURSDAY 
SeniorCitizens Center is 
open for lunch, activities. 

•••••Pen MMMMMMMM Birthday party for resi-
dents of Rising Star Nurs-
ing Center, 2 

Rising StarJr. High and 
High School boys physi-
cals will be given August 
6 t 7 p.m. in Dr. Carpen-
ters office. All entering 6th 
graders and 9th graders 
are required to take a 
physical. 

Physicals for 7, 8, 9, 10, 
11 and 12th graders are 

Emergency Medical 
Services was one of the 
main topics at the County 
Commissioners Court 
meeting Monday. 

County Judge Scott 
Bailey brought a letter to • a Court from Eastland 
Memorial Hospital Ad-
ministrator Marcia Carr 
stating that ambulance 
service from the hospital 
would end if the county-
city subsidy ends Sept. 30. 

Along with the letter 
was a copy ofth e proposed 
1991-92 budget for basic 
emergency medical serv-
ices. But the Commission-
ers were asked to take 
notice that the budget was 
based on the assumption 
that subsidies would con-
tinue. 

"As you know," the let-
ter continued, "Eastland 
County has tendered 
their notice of termina-
tion under the present 
contract. This termina-
tion becomes effective 
Sept. 30, 1991.... "There-
fore, as Eastland Memo-
rial Hospital will have no 
ambulances, please be 
advised that effective 12 
p.m. Sept. 30, 1991 
Eastland Memorial Hos-
pital will no longer be 
providing Emergency 
Medical Services. 
"If it is Eastland 

County's desire to have 
Eastland Memorial Hos-
pital continue the Emer-
gency Medical Service 
after that date, please 
advise us on or before 
Sept. 1, 1991." 

She went on to say that 
the Hospital would be 
willing to provide the 
services under the same 
terms and conditions as 
the present contract un-
til such time as other 
arrangements can be 
made by the city, county 
or both. 

Included in the ar-
rangements referred to is 
that two fully equipped 
Emergency Service ve-
hicles are provided at no 
cost to Eastland Memo-
rial Hospital to operate, 
and collision and liability 
insurance is provided for 
the EMS at no cost to 
Eastland Memorial Hos-
pital. 

Subsidies on operation 
are provided by the City 
or Eastland and the 
county, with the county's 
share around $25,000 
annually. An equal Emer-
gency Medical Service 
subsidy is provided to the 
other three Precincts in 
the county. 

Some weeks ago the 
Commissioners Court 
stated that the county is 
using up its reserves and 
can no longer subsidize 
ambulances or other 
Emergency Services. 

In discussing the let-
ter, Comm. Richard 
Robinson said: "We 
started this, knowing we 
couldn't keep on forever. 
We were hoping they 
would see the value of it -
they are definitely mak-
ing money." 

The Commissioners 

3RD MONDAY 
Ambulance Volunteers, 
Rising Star EMS meet-
ing 

optional. You must h ave a 
physical before you may 
participate in athletics. 

High School football 
practice gear will be is-
sued August 8 at the field 
house, starting at 7 p.m. 
Seniors will be issued gear 
first. 

EACH MONDAY 
Meals 	Wheels come 
from Cisco to Rising Star 
Senior Citizens Center. 
Make reservdtions, 643- 

Chamber of Commerce 
& Agriculture, Peoples 
State Bank, 8 p.m. 

HOMECOMING 
Rising Star Homecoming 

will be Saturday, October 19. 

Due to all the activity 
and preparation for our 
recent 4th of July Free-
dom Festival, Star Pride's 
reporter is playing catch-
up this week. Some of the 
news is older news, but 
we want to report it none 
the less. 

We will start with when 
the barrels were painted 
the secund time (after they 
had to be sandblasted 
because of rust spots 
bleeding through the first 
painting). Workers meet-
ing at the First Baptist 
Church Activity Building 
were LaQuita Lucas, Faye 
Medley, Frances Agnew, 
Edith Bibb, Keith Bibb, 
Janell Caudle and Tonya 
Killion. Star Pride would 
like to thank the First 
Baptist Church for use of 
their activity building for 
this project. 

As the barrels were fi- 
nally painted and the Star 
Pride logo proudly dis-
played, the barrels were 
distributed around the 
downtown area. Helping 
with this endeavor were 
Willie Vandivere, James 
Ramsay, Helen Donham, 
Ruby Murdoch, Janell 
Caudle, Judi Butler, Joy 
Harris, Tonya Killion, 
Steve Harrelson and Jean 
Ramsay. Dirt for the bar-
rels was furnished by 
Wilburn and Janell 
Caudle. Peat moss was 
added and mixed into dirt 
and flowers were planted 
in the barrels. Flowers 
were donated by Dan's 
Greenhouse, Genie Cor-
nett, Ruby Murdoch, 
Dorothy Dunn, Janell 
Caudle and Faye Medley. 
Thank you so much. 

Star Pride's work pro-
gressed as we moved onto 
Goss Monumentproperty. 
Here, as well as some 
other areas, clean-up was 
really a chore. Workers 
on this area included 
Steve Harrelson, Joy 
Harris, David Harris, 
Martha Joyce, Debbie 
Winfrey, Janell caudle, 
Anna Barnes and Tonya 
Killion. 

Jake and Sue Landess' 
vacant lot, the Crawford 
property across Highway 
183 and the triangle-
shaped lot on the corner 
were next. Workers on 
this area were James 
Ramsay, Jean Ramsay, 
Barbara Kanady, Craig 
Scoville, Steve Harrelson, 
Tonya Killion, Gene Lyon, 
Gayland Duggan and Al 
Jones. 

Did you notice the trash 
bins downtown? They 
have a new coat of paint, 
thanks to Jean New, Ruby 
Murdoch and LaQuita 
Lucas. 

Workers had their 
hands full at the vacant 
Exxon Station. They were 
Martha Joyce, Debbie 
Winfrey, Jean New, 
Frances Agnew, Nanette 
Goldston, Belinda West. 
Amy West, Janell Caudle, 
Judi Butler, Barbara 
Kanady and Jean 
Ramsay. The kids kept 
each other busy so their 
moms could work. These 
were Brandi Goldston, 
Dusty Goldston, Kandi 
Myers, Penny Winfrey 
and Kailani Killion. Most 
of this same group worked 

Fourth of July Celebra-
tion a wonderful memory 
for everyone. We are 
proud to have citizens 
such as you who are will-
ing to work to make our 
city beautiful. Thank You! 

Mayor Jerrell D. Bible 
Councilpersons: James 

Cook, Billy Harmon, Edra 
Butler, Randy Goldston 
and Charles Barnes. 

On behalf of the citizens 
of the City of Rising Star, 
Mayor Jerrell Bible and 
the Councilmen ofthe City 
of Rising Star wish to 
express our appreciation 
to each and every Star 
Pride worker and all other 
volunteers for your efforts. 
All of your hard work has 
made our City beautiful 
and helped to make our 
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Construction 

Lynn Hutton 
725-7582 

or 
Jim Ratliff 
643-6464 

Callfor estimate on any 
construction jobs. 

Fullen Motor Co. 
305 East Main Eastland 629-2676 
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TRUCKS! TRUCKS! AND MORE TRUCKS!!! 

NEW 

All new 1991 Suburbans and Full 
Size Blazers now have a $2500.00 
rebate. Come in now for our best 
deals ever on these units!!! 

Fullen Motor Co. is pleased 
to announce that we will 
honor GMC's $500.00 direct 
mail coupon towards the re-
tail purchase or retail lease of 
my new 1990-91 C/K Pickup 
or Chassis-Cab. 
This allows you up to a 
51500.00 rebate on select 
models. Customers can use 
their coupon as down pay-
ment or receive cash back in 
the form of a check from 
Chevrolet. There's no better 
time than now to make a 
change for the better!! 

Also, S/10 Pickups & 4 door S/10 
Blazers have up to $1,000.00 re- 
bate and as low as 1.9% financing. 

Rebates Assigned To Dealer. 
Low Interest Available To Qualified Buyers. 

Call Collect 817-629-2676. Open Monday-Friday 8 a.m. till 6 p.m. 
Closed Saturday And Sunday 

The Rising Star 

Senior Citizens Center Obituaries 
by Marjorie West 

Thursday, July 11, 1991 

Star Pride's 
Yard of the Week 

The Fourth ofJuly, was 
enjoyed by our Senior citi-
zens, the lunch and music 
was great. We saw a lot of 
friends we had not seen in 
a while. We had a nice 
visit with Detta Webb of 
Abilene. She lived in Ris-
ing Star for several years. 

Our town, looked so 
pretty and especially the 
barrels of flowers on the 
sidewalks at the busi-
nesses. I love flowers and 
they were the first I saw 
when I came through 
town. 

The parade was the best 
in years. There were a lot 
of beautiful entries from 
out of town, along with 
our local entries. 

We are sorry Edith 
Bostick is back in the 
hospital for more tests to 
be made. She was doing 
great before she had this 
flare-up. we hope she will 
be much better soon. 

We are sorry to hear 
Kenneth Murdock of the 
Williams Community has 
been ill and had major 
surgery in a Dallas hospi-
tal. We hope he will be 
much better real soon. 

H.L. and Erma Sherrill 
have been on a trip to 
South Texas to visit her 

Auditions for 
Wrangler Belles 
at CJC July 12 

'Bill' Shelton 
Minna Head 
Harding W.T. "Bill" Shelton, 75, 

ofTemple was found dead 
at his home Friday. 
Graveside services were 
held Monday at 11 a.m. at 
Rising Star Cemetery, 
with the Rev. Darrell 
Dossey officiating. 

Mr. Shelton was in the 
real estate business. 

He was preceded in 
death by his wife, Billie 
Faye Wilson Shelton, in 
1983. 

Survivors include three 
sons, Tommy Shelton of 
China Springs, Jackie 
Shelton of Houston and 
Bobby Shelton of Harri-
son, Ark.; a brother, 
Jackie Shelton of Lytle; a 
sister, Mary Jane Mer-
chant of San Antonio; six 
grandchildren; and sev-
eral great-grandchildren. 

Big Country year round. 
The organization also 
provides a training in 
professionalism, individ-
ual character and self 
esteem. In recent years 
the group has traveled 
often making appear-
ances in the Macy's 
Thanksgiving Day Parade 
in New York, the Ap-
pleblossom Festival in 
Winghester, Va. and the 
Fiesta de Tabasco in Vil- 

Auditions for the Cisco 
Junior College Wrangler 
Belles are scheduled for 
July 12, at 1:00 p.m. in 
the CJC gymnasium. 
Students accepted into the 
performing group will be 
recipients of an activity 
scholarship that ranges 
from $600 to $1000 per 
year. 

The Wrangler Belles 
actively promote the col-
lege through numerous 
appearances around the lahermosa, Mexico. 

brother and sister-in-law, 
which is very sick and is 
in the hospital. Then on 
by to see her only sister in 
Kingsland. They had a 
real good trip but are glad 
to be home. 

Visiting Lucy Curtis 
over the 4th of July holi-
day was her granddaugh-
ter, Sharyn Gabbard and 
great-granddaughter, 
Ashley. They enjoyed the 
parade and B-B-Q lunch-
eon. When asked which 
day of the week they en-
joyed most thats what 
they said. 

T. J. came in Monday 
for meals on wheels, sev-
eral were still out of town 
for the weekend holiday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marshall 
Bailey visited Bill Gray 
the 4th of July. 

Bobby and Inez Elliott's 
4th of July and weekend 
visitors was their son, 
Scotty of Eastland, their 
granddaughter and her 
little sons from Monahans 
and another granddaugh-
ter and her husband and 
two son s from Fort Worth. 

We are glad to get the 
report that L.T. Owen is 
athome after bypassheart 
surgery. We hope he will 
be well very soon. 

Personal 

John McBride 

Minna Head Harding, 
86, died Wednesday, July 
3, at a Bellville nursing 
home. Services were at 2 
p.m. Saturday at the 
Church of Christ in Ris-
ing Star, with Gary 
Adams officiating. Burial 
was in Rising Star Ceme-
tery, directed by Higgin-
botham Funeral Home in 
Rising Star. 

Mrs. Harding was born 
in Coleman County. She 
was a member of the 
Church of Christ and the 
widow of E.V. "Slim" 
Harding. 

Survivors include four 
sons; Billy C. Harding of 
Levelland, Bobby M. 
Harding of Rising Star, 
Eddy B. Harding of Mid-
land, and Larry G. Har-
dingof Gonzales; a daugh-
ter, Jill Ann Junek of 
Hempstead; a sister, Ger-
trude Seymour of Corona, 
Calif.; ten grandchildren; 
and eightgreat-grandchil-
dren . 

Both Luther and Jessie Swift were born and 
raised in the Rising Star area and graduated 
from Rising Str High School. They moved away 
and came back to Rising Star in 1985. They are 
recipients of the Star Pride Yard of the Week. 
If you would like to be able to qualify for 
recipient of Yard of the Week, please contact 
LaQuita Lucas at 643-3050 for membership in 
Star Pride. 

Girls who are unable to 
attend the open audition 
can make arrangements 
with the director for an 
individual audition before 
August 18. For more in-
formation please contact 
Cisco Junior College 817/ 
442-2567 or Debbie Baker 
817/442-1139. 

A family get together 
was held at Bob Inglet's 
on July 6 for a BBQ. At-
tending were Clinton and 
Juanita Crisp of Rising 
Star, Andy and Millie 
Milan of Brownwood, 
Mark and Ann of 
Brownwood, Patricia of 
Brownwood, Delia Eisen-
hower of Brownwood, 
Manda Wall ofMcCamey, 
Earlene of Rising Star and 
Marie of Brownwood. All 
had a good time. 

The Life Of Christ Pageant 
Begins Summer Production 

Ricky Allan 
Fernandez 

Pioneer Patchwork 
Abilene 

Grand Prix 
July 13-14 

Life of Christ Pageant 
halfway between Cisco 
and Eastland, on U.S. 
Highway 80. 

For further information 
and brochures contact the 
Life of Christ Pageant 
Rout No. 2, Box 46, Cisco, 
TX 76437 or phone 817-
629-8672. 

LLANO-Ricky Allan 
Fernandez, 27, died Sun-
day from injuries sus-
tained in an auto accidnet 
in Llano County. Services 
were at 2 p.m. Wednes-
day at Higginbotham 
Funeral Home Chapel in 
Rising Star with the Rev. 
Darrell Dossey officiating. 
Burial was in Rising Star 
Cemetery. Local arrange-
ments were made by 
Waldrope-Hatfield Fu- 

neral Home of Llano. 
Mr. Fernandez was born 

in Clovis, N.M. He was a 
Catholic and a heavy 
equipment operator for 
Georgia Stone Company 
of Alberton, Ga. 

Survivors include a half 
sister, Fatima Garcia of 
Cleburne; and an aunt 
and one uncle, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Lewis of Llano. 

John Homer McBride, 
77, of Waco die .d at 4:30 
a.m. Sunday after a 
lengthy illness. Services 
were held Tuesday at 
10:30 a.m. at Higgin-
botham Funeral Home in 
Rising Star, with burial 
in May Cemetery. 

Born in Mayon Septem-
ber 19, 1913, he was a 
retired heavy equipment 
operator. 

Survivors include his 
wife, Eula McBride of 
Waco; a daughter, Linda 
Wilson of Garland; three 
stepsons, Doyle Edmiston 
of Roscoe, Coy Edmiston 
of Arlington, and Jodie 
Edmiston ofAlvarado; two 
stepdaughters, Janelle 
Eoff and Joyce Shetter, 
both of Odessa; three 
grandchildren, Jackie 
Wilson of Fort Worth, 
Chris Wilson of Garland 
and Kelly McBride of 
Brownwood, and seven 
brothers, Stanley, Dow 
W., Ernest, Dale, Jack and 
Joe, all of Brownwood, and 
James McBride of 
Abilene. 

He was preceded in 
death by a son, Bobby H. 
McBride of Brownwood, 
and a stepson, Jack Ray 
Edmiston. 

Sipe Springs News 

The Abilene Sunburn 
Grand Prix, the premier 
club racing event in the 
nation in 1991 for the 
Sports Car Club of Amer-
ica, will be held at 
Abilene's Regional Air-
port on Saturday and 
Sunday, July 13-14 from 
8 a.m. to 6 p.m. Ticket 
cost is $10 per person per 
day with children under 
12 free when accompanied 
by an adult. Military 
members will be admit-
ted for $8 per day. 

In addition to racing, 
other highlights include a 
Confederate Air Force fly-
by, a patriotic salute to 
Armed Forces, live enter-
tainment (highlighted by 
Johnny Dee and the 
Rocket 88's) and food and 
beverage booths. 

For further information 
on the event, call (800) 
727-7704. 

Summer productions of 
The Kendrick Religious 
Pageant "The Life of 
Christ" termed by the July 
1980 edition of the Texas 
Monthly Magazine as 
being the best outdoor 
drama in the State of 
Texas, will begin July 11 
and will be presented each 
Thursday and Friday 
night at 9 p.m. through 
August 9. The production 
is two hours in length. 

This production, now 
into its 27th year of pres-
entations, is the complete 
Life of Christ from the 
birth through the resur-
rection portrayed in 63 
scenes by a cast of dedi-
cated Christian people of 
all walks of life and reli-
gious denominations. The 
production is Non-De-
nominational, with the 
script being taken word 
for word from the King 
James version of the Holy 
Bible with nothing added 
or taken from. Included 
with the cast is a grey 
donkey for the Mother 
Mary, a white donkey for 
the Triumphant Entry of 
Jesus, a camel for the 
wisemen, and sheep for 
the shepards in the field.  

Admission is $5 per 
person. Free parking and 

Immunization 
Clinic To Be 
Held July 11 

In an effort to ease over-
crowding, Texas Depart-
ment of Health, located at 
611 West Commerce, 
Eastland, will hold two 
immunization clinics this 
month. The usual clinic 
will be held on Thursday, 
July 11th. 

A second clinic has been 
scheduled for Wednesday, 
July 17th. Clinic hours are 
from 10:00 A.M. until 
11:00 A.M. and 1:00 P.M. 
until 3:00 P.M. Parent or 
legal guardian are re-
quired to be present (proof 
of guardianship is re-
quired). 

You need to bring a copy 
of the childs immuniza-
tion record or letter from 
the school stating what 
the child's needs. For more 
information call 629-1788. 

overnight camping is al- 
lowed on the grounds. 
Electric and water hook-
ups are available for a 
minimal fee. Advance 
reservations are a must 
for hookups. Clean 
restrooms are available on 
the grounds for the con-
venience of those attend-
ing. 

Also located on the 
pageant grounds is Texas' 
only all Religious Diorama 
and Museum which is 
open every day of the year 
from 10 a.m. until 4 p.m. 
on production days the 
Diorama closes at 3 p.m. 

The Diorama is scenes 
from both the Old an New 
Testaments set with 140 
life sized figures as realis-
tic as is possible with 
narration, also from the 
KingJames Bible, and soft 
organ music for each 
scene. As you view the 
scenes, you are actually 
standing right in the 
midst of the figures, giv-
ingyou the feelingofbeing 
right there with the bibli-
cal characters. Admission 
to the Diorama is children 
6 through 11 $2 and Adults 
$2.50. Each tour lasts 1 1/ 
2 hours. 

So now, plan a spirit 
filled trip and come to the 

The community re-
ceived 1/4 inch of rain on 
Wednesday, and in some 
spots 1/2 inch. Even up to 
2 inches of rain was re-
ported by some residents. 
Of course, the environs of 
the community of Pioneer 
reach several miles in all 
directions from the sign 
on Highway 36. 

Frankie and Oliver 
Smith visited his brother, 
Floyd Smith, on Friday, 
in the Brownwoodihospi-
tal. They visited her fa-
ther, Mr. Perry Vinson, 
on Sunday in Eastland 
hospital. Roxie and Bobby 
Nance and the twins spent 
the night Saturday on 
their way home from 
Possum Kingdom. 

Jean Fore's visitors 
since Friday were Bessie 
McDaniel, her daughter, 
Doris Hunter and Casey 
Hunter of Alamagordo, 
NM, Vi Harlow, Paul and 
Juanita Harlow of Lov-
ington and grandson, 
Ryan Harlow, of Clovis, 

NM. Paul and Juanita's 
friends, Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Watson and two 
grandsons, Craig Watson 
and Tyson Burkett of 
Lovington, NM. also were 
visitors in our area. 

Pioneer residents at-
tended the AARP meet-
ing last Monday in Cross 
Plains. The six were Jean 

In Service 

P.J. Burrows of Califor-
nia is visiting his aunt, 
Mrs. Mae Leonard. 

Others visiting have 
been Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Stokes of Brownwood, 
Denise Graves and baby 
of Belton, Nancy Leonard 
of Rising Star, Gayle 
Leonard of Fort Worth 
and George Leonard of 
Rising Star. 

Happy 
Birthday 

JULY 12 

Defensive 
Driving 

Renee Aleman has been 
promoted in the U.S. Air 
Force to the rank of senior 
airman. 

Aleman is a Morse sys-
tems operator at Wheeler 
Air Force Base, Hawaii. 

She is the daughter of 
Timothy P. O'Connor of 
Rising Star and Ronda J. 
Cole of 1028 E. Bender, 
Hobbs, N.M. 

Her husband, Steven, is 
the son of Gloria J. Ale-
man of Beltsville, Md. 

She graduated from 
Rising Star High School 
in 1988. 

Use The 
Classifieds 

Cisco Junior College 
will offer a Defensive 
Driving Course on Mon-
day and Wednesday, July 
15 and 17 from 6-10 p.m. 
The calss will meet in 
room 3 of Schaefer hall. 
Fee for the course is $20. 
Enrollment must be paid 
no later than 3 p.m. on 
July 15. Students must 
attend both night of the 
course and must bring a 
valid drivers license to 
class. 

For more information 
contact Charlotte Speegle 
at 817/442-2567, exten-
sion 122. 

The musical on Satur-
day night at the center 
was enjoyed by all and we 
had a good attendance. 

The Baptist church had 
a good attendance Sun-
day morning and night. 

We were saddended by 
the death of Bill Shelton 
ofTemple and Mrs. Minna 
Harding.They were resi-
dence of here at one time. 
We extend our sympathy 
to their families and all 
relatives. 

The Weaver reunion 
was held at Lake Leon 
this weekend. Mr. and 
Mrs. T.A. Weaver, Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Smith of 
Rising Star, and Mrs. 
Code Weaver and son, 
Todd and wife of Garland. 

Herman Boswell of Ar-
lington spent Sunday with 
his brother and wife, 
Travis and Virginia 
Boswell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lane Cot-
ter ofPioneer visited their 
daughter, Mrs. Pat Le-
sley, Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
and son,Justin, ofComan-
che visited her grand-
mother, Ruby Wyatt, 
Sunday afternoon. 

by Irma Miller 

Fore, Jewel Foster, John 
and Irma Miller and Bob 
and Barbara Powell. They 
heard an interesting and 
informative talk by Judge 
Scott Bailey, Eastland 
County Judge. 

Nell and Joe Fleming 
received several guests 
during the week. Mr. and 
Mrs. Buell Foley of Lub-
bock and Billie Freeman 
of this community were 
there Tuesday morning, 
on Wednesday morning, 
Sam Fleming of Cross 
Plains, and on Saturday 
afternoon Alton Watson 
and Cherry Smith of 
Pampa. Mrs. Cleo Barton 
of this community visited 
on Sunday afternoon. 

Novilia Barton visited 
Joe and Nell Fleming on 
Sunday and stopped at 
Charlene and Jim 
Fleming's and enjoyed ice 
cream containing fresh 
peaches. Mr. and Mrs. 
Roger Pierson of the com-
munity invited Novilia 
over for a 4th of July cele-
bration where Roger had 
prepared a delicious out-
door meal. 

John and Irma Miller 
went to Abilene Sunday 
evening with Ruby 
McCowen, Gertie Powell, 
and Naomi McCowen, of 
Cross Plains, to hear 
Mikie Ratliff speak. He is 
a former Pioneer resident, 
son of Elaine Pancake, 
grandson ofCrace (Curry) 
(Eakin) Hierholzer. Bill 
and Elaine Pancake of the 
community were also 
present. The exhortation 
and foretelling and forth-
telling, which seemed 
especially sweet to his 
relatives and those who 
had known and loved him 
for so long, showed that 
Mike had certainly done 
his homework. 

The pastor of the Pio-
neer Pentecostal Church, 
Mrs. Ruby McCowen of 
Cross Plains, instructed 
this writer how to include 
in the Patchwork the fol-
lowing invitation: The 
Pentecostal Church in 
Pioneer invites you to a 
watermelon feast begin- 
ning at 7 p.m. Thursday, 
July 18. Immediately 
thereafter, a gospel sing 
and musical will be hosted 
by Bill and Elaine Pan-
cake. 

Curtis Bishop, Sherry 
Burk, Tina Byrd 

JULY 13 
011ie Burns, Denise 

Leonard, David Fisher, 
Toni Hill Larri son 

JULY 14 
Tommy Bibb, Wanda 

Hughes, 	Benjamin 
Donham 

JULY 15 
Shannon Smoot, Nell 

Butler, Melba Cathey, 
Dale Barnard 

JULY 16 
H.A. Witt Jr., Clarissia 

Atwood 
JULY 17 
Karen Perkins, Ruth 

Perkins 
JULY 18 
Dee Dee Lewis, David 

Morris, James Lee Mor- 
ris 

CLASSIFIEDS = 

Green & Associates 
Debra J. Green, Agent 

Your Home Town Insurance Agency 

P.O. Box 144 
Rising Star, Texas 76471 

Bus. Phone 	Home Phone 
(817)643-7817 	(817)643-397452 
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Read The 
Classifieds 

INSURED 
CORPORATE 

BONDS 
9.00%* 

For years, smart investors have turned 
to corporate bonds for quality, safety 
and high returns. Now, Edward D. 
Jones & Co. offers all those advan-
tages, plus insurance as to the timely 
payment of principal and interest. 
If you want to take advantage of 
insured corporate bonds, call or stop 

by today. 
Robert L. Steed 
107 W. Main 

Eastland, Texas 76448 
NA/ 	 (817)629-385 1 

Edward D. Jones & Co.' 
Who.. $. - 	InOW•01 	IWO Settnilfte..111t. 	C Ont. 11.1... 

' Rate expressed as yield lo maturity cheerio! 

7\8\91, 	Subject to availability. Market risk 

is a consideration on low:Intents sclt1 prior In 

maturity. 

• .1.‘ 

KAY BAILEY 
REAL ESTATE 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES & ACREA6E 
Excellent Commercial lam Hwy. 80 East, Eastland, approx. 180' x 2.03', Gry Utilities 

Available, $30,000. 
1-20 Near Hwy. 6,180' x 150' lot, Reduced fur Quick Sale, 317,000. Just West of pcpular 

restaurant and service statical. 
Hunters Paradise, 252 sc. way an in the "Ebacnies , Takes a rugged .vetitilc run to get to 

it Very isolated 5400 per ac. Has an old house at it in fairly good stare. 
166 ac, Near Eastland, Good Access, Fair Fences, Mostly wooded & pasture, sane 

cultivation, could set of pens, could be divided, 3550 pa ac. 
We Also have several other tracts of land including two 6.5 ac. places, 24 sc.„ 40 ac., 402 

ac., 42 ac., 49 ac., 56 ac, and will have further details in next ad. 
Commercial acreage, approx. 50 ac., off Hwy. 80 E., Eastland, Prime location few future 

development. Pleas call for details. 
Wash & Dry Laundromat, Essilsridis Ina% laundry facility, Hwy. 80 E. location, High 

Traffic location, Stays Busy! 590,030. 

We Offer Complete Property Management Services. If you're 
tired of the hassle of taking care of rental property, Call Us' 
WE APPRECIATE THE OPPORTUNITY TO SERVE YOU. WE 
SPECIALIZE IN "AFTER FIVE" AND WEEKEND SHOW-
INGS. 

P.O. BOX 693 - EASTLAND, TEXAS 76448 
R.G. (Buck) Wheat, Broker 
629-2365 	629-8514 

Eastland Homo 
Exclusive Suhdlyldon, Custom 3 BR, I 3/4 Bath, Brick, Approx. 2,300 so. ft., Wooded 

Lot, All The Airrnitks including Rock Fireplace, Wet Bar, Cathedral Coiling, bunlated 
Master, Super Madam w/Caser Island, Formal Dining, 0113STCOM, & MOTel 398.500. 

Dream Home, Nearly Ncw 3 BR, 217 Bath, Brick, rear Lake Leon, ahead as 3.65 sc., 
hotels imally Decorated, Gorgeous Wallpaper, plush Carpet, Massive Master Suite, Formal 
Dining„ Unique Livisg Rm. w/lots of Glass & Spiral Staircan to loft 51 20,000 . 

LOVELY 4 BR, 2 3/4 Bath. Formal Living & Dining, Fantastic kitchen, am. Breakfast 
Rm., Family Rm. Ye/Bookshelves, Panne' Flocsa/Area Rugs, Carpet in BR's, Woodertial 
Backyard, huge Oak Trees, Privacy Rare, Patios: A Rare Opportunity to own ore of the 
outstanding S. Seaman St. Homes. $125,000. 

OWNER TRANSFERRED, Contestable 3 BR, 2 Bath, Builtin Bookshelves & 
Fireplace in Living Rm., Formal Dining w/Beautiful Crystal Chandelier, Breakfast Nook off 
Kitchen, Large Bedrooms, Ceiling Fans & Miniblinch throughout, Trees, 334100. 

Victorian Style. 3 BR (Could It 4), Professicruilly Decorated far that "LightBtight" 
feeling. from the etre:stet Yellow Faterior to the beautiful wallpaper inside, Modern Kitchen, 
Formal Dining, Utility, Large Corner Lot, $68,500. 

Country Living in town, 3 BR, 21/2 Bath, Brick Home surrounded by huge Pod Oaks on 
93 ac,, fenced & erossfenced, sep. dining, Spacious Open Living Area, Woodbuming Heater, 
large Mater Suite, Oversized Utility, Pretty Patio built around trees, $53,000. 

Seller Finance, Nice 3 Bedroom, 1 3/4 Bath, Franc w/Siding, corner lot, large Lying/ 
dining combo, turakfast nook in kitchen, lots of trees et shrubs, A dun= to live in an extra 
nice neighborhood at a budget price, complete w/CH&A,329,C00. 

Cute & Cory 2 BR situated on 4 Beautiful lots Wirt of Big Trees, Fireplace, Carpet, 
Bulking, Sun Room could double far 3rd BR, Small Equity & Possible Anumptitm. sndwo. 

Still Mire The Farm? This Roomy 3 BR, 1 3/4 Bath Prime Hann has 13 at. Including 
Shed, Pens, & Tank, and you still have all the convenieces of Town, Huge Master BR, All 
Kinds of Closet & Storage Space, Woodbuming Heater, Pretty Patio, Faced, 335,001 

Ponlhie Asnimption, 3 BR, 2 Bath, Frame ,/Siding, Carpet, Bann, auk Fenced 
Backyard, Formal Dining, Detached Garage, Cana La, Attie Space, Too Chap at 322,003 

Sprawling 3 BR, 1 314 Bath, Frame/Siding on oversized corm lot, carpet, custom 
dares, formal dining, big country kitchen sr/breakfast area, large master BR/sitting am., 

detathed two-stay bldg. fa office, tubby, or mother. in-law, 559,900. 
Popular Area,Extra nice 3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick, Carpet, Builtins, OVA. Formal Lives/ 

Dining, Den, Cramenian, Fireplace, Privacy Fence, Storage Shed, RV Parking, Cubed Flower 
Beds Selling below purchase price, 383,000. 

Unique Rock flame, Complete winew carpet, wallpaper, CH/A, Bearical & Plorobiat 
Lines, restores six large comfortable rooms, 3 fireplaces, builtins, utility nn., & concrete 
picnic table. Even the Roof is new! $39,500. 

Quiet Sneer, Cornet La, & Good Neighbors cane w/this large 2 BR, 2 Bath, Mobile 
I lone, carpet, OVA. builtins, wader & dryer, name shad, attached carport,319,500. 

Golfers, This 3 BR, 2 Bath, Doublewide flame ablated co 1 K. faces tit Gulf OALIICt 
Carpet. Baths, Cl VA, Fireplace, Utility Rm., Deck, 627,500. 

Ideal Investment, This 3 BR Haire stays tented, Big roams, Formal Dining Rrn., Roof 
has been patched, but priced accordingly, 316,000. 

Executive Home, 3 BR, 3 Bath, log/Stnee/Glas, on 3.77 wooded ac,, Open Living 
Design w/Massive Rock Fireplace covering aw wall, Magnificent Kitchen Wall the gadgets, 
Office, Utility, Covered perch all tams back, 3160,000. 

EASTLAND AREA HOMES& LAKE LEON  
Custom Built Brick Horne, Approx. 1,860 al. ft., situated cn approx. I ac. completely 

fenced, 3 BR, I 3/4 Bath, Fireplace, Builtins, VA. New Carpet, Utility, 2-Car Garage, 
Covered Patio, nor. bldgs., pens, gardat, One of the nicest harts in Olden! $63,900. 

It's Summertime, and the living is easy, Pretty 3 BR, 2 Bally Brick, like-New Can:talon 
Throughout, carpet, drapes, Cl VA, Fireplace, Builtim, stained Glass, Patio, 2-Car Garage, 
Inge court lot Eanl and Schools, Carbon. $52,000. 

Horse Lovers Take NatWest as a Pin 2 BR Mobile I lone in Olden, approx. 3/4 ac. 
complete w/fenced area, sled & pens for "Trigger", cool central air Side, 519,500. 

Attention Mobile liorne Owners, Beautiful Wooded Acreage to put your home on, 
Approx. 3/4 ac., hookups already them, 37,800. 

Lake Leon, Really Nice 2 BR, 2 Bath Mobile Home, 14' x 80, Screened Porch all across 
lake side, OVA, situated at 2 Deeded Lon, Pipe-Rail Fate., Boat Dock w/Electrie lift, Deep 
Water, Private Location, Pries Reduced! $35,000, 

Lake Leon, Large 2 BR, Brick HMI; Deeded lot, Staff Meter, CIVA, Fireplace, Big 
Open living Rm/Kitchcn, Rifted Yard, Waterfront, Recluced for Quick Sale! S40,000. 

Lake Leon, New 3 Bcdet0111, 2 Bath, Brick Home, Carpet, &satins, Fireplace, CIVA, 
Jacuzzi, Redwood Dcck wf lot Tub, Deeded Lot, Staff Meter, 312,500. 

Lake Leon, Waterfront Iota, Deeded, $6,000 & up. Also have several Ices in town $2,500 
to 310,000. 

LAKE LEON HOMES AND LOTS 
574.403-3 BR. 2 Bath. needy butt, stunning brick home on deeded 

lake frontage lot. CH/A, fireplace, rich carpeting throughout, 
enormous master bath with JacuzzL Large balcony with hot tub, 
overlooking a totally private view of the lake and woods. 

565,400-3BR, 2 Bath. Total electric. Beauldul and unique lake home 
on 125' x 350' leased lot. Built-Ins, range. oven and dishwasher. Ca-
thedral ceiling, large, spacious rooms with walk-In closets. New 
carpet and fireplace. Two storage buildings, staff meter and take 
pump. Apricot. cherry, and many other fruit and native trees. 
Possble owner finance. 

563,000-2 BR, 1 Bath, frame metal with wood home, overlooking 
lake, on deeded lot. CH/A, Satiate, large storage house. Ceiling 
fans throughout, breaidast bar with custom chairs, Interior is done 
In master craftsmanshko of construction, plurrbing, and wiring. Al 
built-ins with superior design. 

$45,000-Newly remodeled Lake hone with new roof, wiring. plumb-
ing and siding. CA-VA. 3-ton ground unit. All electric in underground 
conduits. Total electric. Lighted walkway over water to lighted boat-
dock platform with picnic table. 12 x 12' well housenvorkshop with 
organizer shelves and compartments. Excellent insulation. Guard 
lights surround home and beautdul lawn on large, deeded lot. 

540,000-4 BR, 2 Bath Home built-mobile home of approx. 1600 sq. 
ft. CH/A, carport, 2 storage buildings with workbench and organiz-
ers. Guard lights. Iron. and back Large cement patio, T.V. Satellite. 
Total electric and energy efficient. Irrigation system for lawn and 
fruit trees plus grape vineyard. Kitchen has built-ins, dishwasher, 
breakfast bar, separate dining area. large windows and custom 
drapes. Wood burning stove with winter's supply of cord wood. 

$55,003-2 BR, 2 Bath mobile home on two large deeded lots with 
huge shade trees. Home has big. insulated. glassed-In Gunroom 
and great lake frontage on deep water. 565' chain link fence 
surrounds home. Concrete boat dock hook-ups. Comes completely 
furnished with quality furnishings. including: new carpet, drapes, 
ceiling fans, new refrigerator, was her/dry er, built-Ins, allfurnishings 
in Irving room, sun room, dining room, and bed rooms. T.V. Satellite, 
Staff Meter and 250 galbn butane tank A lovely home. 

$30,000-2 BR, 1 Bath home on deeded lot. Large kitchen. Pump 
house with pump. 

$23,000-Two deeded lots on prime lake frontage near Lone Cedar 
Country Club. Small boat dock, deep water. 

$6,000-Deeded waterfront lake lots on lake frontage. Private and 
wooded area. 

34,500-Two lake front lots at $4.500. each. 
$78,000-Big, Beautiful 4 BR Lake Horne done in rough cedar. 

Approx. 2000 sq. ft. with 2 car carport. Skylights, cathedral ceilings 
and ceding fans. 2 air conditioning systems for energy efficiency In 
the total electric home. Wet bar, indirect lighting, mirrored wall and 
closets. T.V. Satelfne, built-in dishwasher, compactor, wine rack, 
counter top range w/self-cleaning oven. Jenn-Air cook island. Spa-
cious bedrooms and closets. Outstanding fireplace. Stall Meter and 
boat dcck on approx. 150' x 175' deeded lot. Very impressive home. 

EASTLAND HOMES AND LOTS  
$2.506for two 50' x 140' lot with trees. Centrally located. 
35.000-for two lots Si town. Lots have been cleared. 
54,500-Commercial kit 70' x 94'. 
510,000-Commercial town lot 7tr x 110' with 20' x 28' metal building 

and 20 x 12 attached vehicle port. Canasta floor. 
$10,00 -Four hilskle residential lots In exclusive location. 
598.500-3 BR. 1 1/2 Bath. CH/A. 'Friendship' mobile home on 2 

acres of Interstate 20 frontage. Plus a 50 x 70 Metal Building with 
20' it 70' attached metal shed on side. Cky water. Exceptional 
commercial locatbn. 

$120,030-Commercial property off Interstate 20. 50' x 100' Metal 
budding with partition N. to S. through budding. Makes two offices 
or two living quarters. Approx 5,000 sq. ft. CH/A. On 38.693 acres. 
Poss role owner finance. 

35,000-2 BR. 1 Bath. frame home on shady lot. Wit sell in 'as is' 
condition. May be used for commercial or residential venture. 

$6,000-3 BR, 1 Bath on good city lot. Very little needed to make a 
really cute home. 

58.000-3 BR. 1 B. on large shaded lot. A groat value in a livable home. 
510,0033 BR. 1 Bath, frame home with siding. On spacious, shady 

and totally fenced lot. CH/A with heat purrp. 
512,500-Two centrally located homes on two adpining lots. Needs 

work for great investment possibilities as homes or rental prep, 
516.500-2 BR. 2 Bath 'Artcraft" rnobde home on 3 beautdully land-

scaped lots. CHat. Dishwasher, range, lots of cabinet space and 
separate utility area. New carpet and custom drapes. Garden tub- 
in master bath. Back deck of redwood with white guard railing. 
Redwood playhouse and 12' x 12 sandbox for children's play. 

520,000-28R. 1 Bath, frame with siding. Fencedl yard. tots of pecan 
and hurt trees. Single car garage. Very large and new metal budding 
behind house, not visible from 'tont view. Back of metal building has 
big metal doors with electric opener for muftPle vehicles, exiting 
and ordering from alley for total privacy. 

325,000- 2 B R,1 Bath home on 2 big. beautif ul lots. Good roof, secure 
house. Screened in front porch. 2 double car garages, each has is 
own storage budding/ workshop attached. 

528.000-3 BR, 2 Bath home in good neighborhood, CHrA, well-
insulated, storm windows, all new plumbing and wiring. Custom 
drapes and mini-blinds. 5 ceiling fans. kitchen with built-iris. Large 
utility room, walk-in closets. good storage house. Big concrete patio 
and gas Bar-B-Oue grill. 

329.500-2 BR. 1 Bath Irame with siding. Completely remodeled 
interior. New carpet. Built-in oven and counter top range. Superior 
insulation in walls and ceiling. New plumbing and wiring. Double 
carport. Large patio. 

330.000-4 BR, 2 Bath home,excellent location. Beautiful and out-
standing master bedroom. Hone with fantastic value at this price. 

$58.003-Just barely Si town. like new, 4 BR, 2 1/2 Bath, frame with 
siding home. CFVA, energy efficient. Located on 6. acres of lushly 
wooded terrain. Beautdully efficient, low mainlainance home. 

560,030-3 BR. 2 Bath. frame with siding home on 1 1/4 acres. Built-
in. CH/A. swimming pool, game room Unique and energy-en-cent 
home located across street from go! course. 

365,000-4BR, 1 large bath, home with fireplace. Two large concrete 
pates. 7 nuns. from Eastland. School bus stops at property. Small. 
6-room home on property may be used for rental or guest home. 
Both homes located on 23 acres with water well and deep tank. Only 
utility paid is electric. Averages less than $100.00 per month. 

365.000-4 BR, 1 1/2 Bath. Two story. formal arid elegant home with 
European touches. Red tile roof with stucco and wood exterior. 
Imported luau res. exqolsite wallpaper, appointments and chande-
liers from Spain and Italy. A truly lavish home, greatly underpriced. 
Located on 3 large lots, this home has energy efficient CH/A, attic 
fan, excessive Insulation and storm windows. Separate AC studio, 
guest house. or office building located at back of property, Trees in 
abundance, storage house, fish pond, and much more. 

574.800-3 BR. 2 Bath. brick home in exclusNe division or Eastland. 
Home O energy efficient with MA Beautifully done in wallpaper 
and decorator touches kitchen bar and butt-Ins. Front and back 
patios with privacy fences. Large rooms, ceiing fans, double car 
garage with electric door openers, 

585.000.3BR. 2 Bath. large brick home with cathedral ceiling. Excel-
lent location Si shady and quiet neighborhood. Large, beautiful 
game and sun room Two car garage with electric door openers. 
Formal living room fireplace, and built-in desks, bookshelves and 
cabinets in den and living area. Storage house. Truly lovely and 
-pert act condition' home. 

386.5C0-3 BR, 2 Bath, Brick home. Garden bath and mirrored closets 
and bathrooms add a dramatic touch to this extremely unique 
house. CI-VA, energy efficient. Fantastic wet-bar with awning and 
luxurious decorator touches throughout this home. Rock fireplace 
and beamed ceding. All kitchen appliances buill-in. with Jenn-Air is-
land range and breakfast bar. Large. private lot in very exclusive 
part of Eastland. 

396,003-3 BR, 2 Bath huge brick home on 7.25 acres. New and 
dominating country home butt on high hdl, overlooking lake, high-
ways and hint far, far below. Built-in compactor, microwave, tiled 
breakfast stand In kitchen with buffiln range. Birch cabinets and 
woodwork Massive rock fireplace with heat-o-lator. Built-in book-
shelves. room-to-room Intercom system with audiocontrol. Jacuzzi 
in master bath. Satellite dish with controls arid outside speakers. 
Double car garage with electric openers. Tree house for children's 
play. Heavily wooded, private and serene. 

$120,000-3 BR, 2 Bath. Ticare Perfac-r brick home on 10 aaes. Cl-te 
A. double car garage with electric openers, fireplace, white metal 
railing for fence surrounds property. Outbuildings and corrals in 
excellent condition. 

$150000-4 BR, 2 Bath, two story trick hornet on 9 acres in prime 
location. Separate den, dining and living areas. Fireplace with heat. 
olat or, double car garage with electric openers. Multple sky lights. 
wet bar. T.V. talent large barn. A perfectly beautiful 'country' 
location close to town. 

3159,000-4 BR. 2 Bath. five year old brick home on 122 acres. 
Located 8 rrinutes from Eastland. Approx. 2000 sq. ft. CH/A. 
separate dining, utility room• total electric. All Land in coastal Ber-
muda City water plus dug well and deep tank New corrals and 
fencing. 1/2 mineral rights go to buyer. Rock budding for barn. 

$165,0063 BR, 2 Bath, approx 3000 sq. ft. home on 242 acres. 
Located IS mins. from Eastland. CNA. sunken den with cathedral 
ceiling. Now, bait-in appliances Si kitchen. 3 car carport, garage 
and workshop. Barns and pens. Corrals and horse stalls. Creek 
runs through pr perry. 6 acre lake stocked with bass and channel 
cat. Prime hunting acreage. 

5180,030-3 BR, 2 Bath. Brick and siding home with avec:. 2600 sq. 
ft. CI-I/A. Nalke pecans and coastal grass. Branch a' Loon river 
runs through this outstandng property. Approx. '/4 , ntrsed rights 
go with property. City water. Five minutes from Ea Wand. Home is 
located at 220 prime area acres. 

5307,000-Lavish and enormous 2 story rock house, trimmed in rough 
cedar on 200 acres. Highly energy-efficient with CH/A. storm 
windows and extra insulation. Polished wood and site wallpaper 
touches throughout home. Master bath has 5' x 5' shower and 
separate bah with Jacuzzi. Kitchen has built-in dishwasher, com-
pactor and disposaL Brealdast bar. Ceiling fans and rheostat 
lightingthroughout. T.V. Satellite. Land is cultivated, has oil produc- 
tion and two five acre tanks. Three excellent barns, metal corrals 
and pent All mineral rights, oil production and income on 170 acres 
go to buyer. Underground srxinkler systems, 3 wells and dry water. 

$317,000-'Showplace' home on 100 aces or 'country club' property. 
3 BR, each with a private bath. Separate office. KGchen with Nin- 
th Icemaker, wine rack, double, set-cleaning ovens, Jenn-Air, 
Mender, etc, on -pop-up', home center, counter controls. Revolv-
ing kitchen shelves with organizers. Room-to-room, built-in vacuum 
system, and cable T.V. hook-ups in every room. Closets with buit-
in organizers and shoe storage. Huge master bath with private 
patio. 'Matching' 151 1 30' storage house. All electric underground 
conduits] Great fencing. Prof ess tonally decorated and landscaped. 

ELIZABETH MAYNARD 
ASSOCIATE 

559-2318 

LAND, FARMS. RANCHES  
AND SMALL ACREAGE 

$8,000-5.5 acres with small tank surrounded by willows. Access to 
Olden water. Possible owner finance. 

$12,503-15 acres. Cleared land in beautdul location, 15 min. from 
Eastland. Exc. acreage upon which to build. Deep tank on property. 

40 acres-3425.00 per acre. S. of Carbon. Fenced, 1/8 mineral rights 
to buyer. Good hunting. Will consider owner finance. 

40 acres-$600.00 per acre. Fenced, hand dug well, native pecan 
trees. 1 metal shed, I cross fence, 1/2 mineral rights to buyer, with 
leasing rights. Possble owner finance. 

33.21 acres-$2000.00 per acre. 2,000 pecan trees in excellent 
productive condition. Buried 'by walr irrigation system. 2' lines. AU 
mineral rights go. 

80 acres-5600.00 per acre 15 minutes east of Eastland. 1 tank. 
Excelerit hunting, and fishing. 

52 acres-5600.00 per acre. Good hunting and fishing. 20 minutes 
from Eastland. 

50.6 acres-$600.00 per acre. Gorgeous land. Creek runs through 
heavily wooded property. Deer, turkey, quad and dove abound. 50 
to 60 mature pecan 1TEPOS. Good set of pens and storage budding. 

120 acres-$595 an acre, 2 stocked tanks. 1/8 mineral rights to buyer. 
Possble owner finance with 20-25% down. 3 oittges wells on 
property eam approx. 3300.00 to 5400.00 per month. Possible 3 off 
s0 wells to be drilled. Crook runs through property. 

166 acres-3550.00 an acre. Near Eastland lake. Can be divided Into 
40 or 80 acre tracts. Good fences, barn and pens. 

220 acres-see under Eastland homes-5180.000. 
242 acres-see under Eastland homas-$165,000. 
249.3 acres-$425 per acre. Sabanna River runs through property. 2 

deep tanks stocked with Bass and Channel Cat. Perfect hunting lo-
cating. Possible owner finance with 20% down and 10% Int. Heavy 
oil production formerly on property. Property covered heavily with 
fabulous mature pecan trees. 

167 acres-$454.00 per acre. Good hunting and production land just 
west of Cisco. 

80 acres-5500.00 an acre with access to electricity and city water. 
Hand dug well and large, spring-led tank. 10 x 12 Metal building on 
property. Land partially cultivated. 

$89,500-3 BR. 3 Bath. Brick country home, five minutes from down-
town. Located on 6 acres, large home O elegant, with built-in 
microwave, se!- cleaning ovens, Jenn-Air cook island and ceiling 
fans throughout. Large concrete porches. patio, and private, brick-
walled garden dl master bedroom. Fireplace with heat.o-Lator. Big, 
sunny garden room, Beaned and vaulted ceilings. Built-in book-
shelves aid cabinets. Walk-in closets with bust-in organizers. 
Cable T.V. hook-ups In every room. Garden lights, electric garage 
door lifts on 3 car garage. Work shop, barns and metal corrals. Fruit 
trees, oak, pecan and pine. krigation system for trees and garden. 
CHiA, superior insulation and energy efficient home. Perfect con- 

ton. 
$36.00658 R.3 Bath home. F rano with siding. Two story homewith 

almost I acre of land in town. Has been remodeled inside and new 
roof added. CH/A, f .p., outdoor gas grill. Spac. and charming home. 

$4000-3 BR. 1 B. brick home. CH/A, good location. In exc. cond. 
53,00028 lots on 5 acres. Two mobilo home hook-ups. Crty water, 

sewage and electricity. Cedar rail fencing. Ideal for nob. home lots. 

CARBON, CISCO. GORMAN. OLDEN 
Carbon-$2.250, 1 BR, 1 Bath, Kitchen and living room Approx. 600 

sq. ft. home. 
Carbon-515,003, 3 BR, 1 Bath home on 2 lots with trees and garden. 

A small. comfortable home in good repair. 
Carbon-$3.500.2 large lots. Three large paean trees on front of lots. 

Fenced on three sides. Hook-ups available for all city utilities. 
Cisco-$5,000. Brick and tile building, cormercially located. Approx. 

25' x 50'. Central air. Possible owner finance. 
Cisco-$10.700-3 8 R.2 Bath, Approx 2500 sq. ft. home on 1 1/2 acres. 

Hook-ups lor two mobie homes on back of property. 
Cisco $39,500-3 BR 13/4 Bath. CH/A. fenced yard, storage building, 

garage with electric door opener. Utility room, breakfast area off 
kitchen, large Irving room. 

Cisco$54,000-commercial building with residence in rear. (3BR. 21: 
2 Bath), 175' highway frontage. 

Gorman-$72.000-3 BR, 2 Bath. Brick tome on 10 acres. CI-VA, 
double car grape. T.V. Satellite. total electric. Storage house. Any 
mineral rights owned go to buyer. 

Gorman-3197,000-3 BR, 3 Bath. Big. beautdul Brick home on 51 
acres. CH..a. built-ins. utility room. 3 pantries, sewing room. fire-
place. Kitchen bar with all new cook top, double ovens, trash 
compactor, dishwasher and water softner. Patio with Bar-B-Oue, 
swimming pool with automatic controls. 4 separate horse lots with 
covered stalls. cattle crowding pen and squeeze chute. Two horse 
starting gates. Metal shed and 10 stall barn. 

Olden-$38,503-3 BR, 1 Bath, completely remodeled hone on 4 big 
Ids. CH/A, Dishwasher ceiling fans, large utility room. new carpet, 
living room has cathedral ceiling and fireplace. New rod, plumbing 
and wiring. Redwood deck with tree in the center, great Bar-B Quo 
grill. Properly Includes small efficiency, guest or rental home. 

Olden-$9,600-2 large BR, 1 bath on 4 lots. Two bindings, house has 
nice screened porch. 

R.G. (BUCK) WHEAT 
BROKER 

DEBRA MAYNARD 
ASSOCIATE 

629-1013 

Moving to Eastland County? Or 
anywhere in U.S.A. Call Toll Free 
1-800-525-8910 Ext. 4365 for 
information. (No Rentals Please) 

EASTLAND: 
CRESTWOOD home reduced! 3 BR, 2 Bath, built-ins, 
Sauna room. E36 
BUDGET STRETCHER! Under 510,000.00! Nice 
Neighborhood. El 
PRICE HAS BEEN LOWERED! 3BR 1 la bath brick 
on corner lot. ONLY $39,900.00. E8 
BEAUTIFUL HOME! 3 BR, 2 bath, formal living 
room, large dcn. In nicc subdivision. E12 
AIRPORT ACRES 3 BR, 21/2 bath brick, remodelled, 
large living area. Large lot, trees. E13 
VACANT LOT - commercial area, near downtown. 
Owner will finance. E30 
NEWLYWEDS! 2 BR, 1 bath frame home in neat 
neighborhood. Under $10,000.00. EIS 
GREAT NEIGHBORHOOD for growing family. 3 BR, 
2 bath brick, !VP, drapes, built-ins. Gamcroorn/sun-
room. A well kept home. Eli 
CRESTWOOD ADDITION, 3 BR, 2 bath brick home. 
F/P, CH/CA, built-ins. Lovely home. E20 
NEWLY REMODELLED 3 BR, 2 bath frame home. 
CH/CA, new siding. Won't last long at this Price! 
$25,000 . E3 
EARLY 1900'S HOME: 1112 Story frame home on 
large lot in desirable location, needs restoration. 9 
rooms, 2 baths. E4 
AFFORDABLE! Below S10,000.00! 2 BR, 1 bath 
frame home on large, fenced lot. Needs some interior 
work, great for handyman! E2 
MANY EXTRAS! 2 BR, 1 bath frame home, fireplace, 
CH/CA. Fenced yard, trees! E26 
BEAUTIFUL trees 	 of with 4 BR, 1 bath 
frame home,formal  •  SOLD 22 
PRETTY LOT. SOLD 'Ides; large 3 BR, I bath 
frame home. E6 
EASY TO BUY, great terms! 3 BR, 1-3/4 bath, CH/CA, 
brick & frame house on corner lot. E5 

OTHER 
NEAR LAKE LEON: Nice dbl. wide 3 BR, 2 bath, 
built-ins, CH/CA, on 1/4 acre w/ lake view, trees.O29 
RANGER: $3,900.00 for 2 BR frame home. 028 
RANGER: Nice 12 yr. old3 BR, 2 bath brick, F/P, built-
ins. Shaded corner lot. 05 
RANGER: Beautiful home! 3 BR, 2 bath brick home; 
kitchen built-ins, workshop. 09 
RANGER: 3 BR, 1 1/2 bath brick home in excellent 
neighborhood. CH/CA, kit. built-ins. Price reduced, 
under 530,000.00. 04 
RANGER: Large 3 BR, 1 bath frame, shaded lot; extra 
lot across street, gar., CP, RV cover. 06 
CISCO: Comfortable 3 BR frame.Kitchen appliances. 
Fenced rear yard; fruit & pecan trees. 02 
CARBON: Shaded corner lot with frame home. Owner 
financing w/appnaved credit. 011 
LAKE CISCOn Addn. 1 BR frame cabin, 
cov. patio. $6, 
CISCO: Large residah mobile home hook-
ups. 012 
CISCO: Approx.5 ac., good for commercial or residen-
tial. Financing available. 013 
CISCO: Rock home 	• SOLD modelled. only blocks 
from school and do 	5 
GORMAN: Numerous listings, .S8,000-545,000. Call 
for details. 
LAKE LEON: Lake cabin on deeded lot, Staff meter, 
fruit trees and lake frontagc. 016 
PICTURESQUE PRIVATY! Nearly new 3 BR, 2 bath 
brick home on large, completely fenced lot. Well for 
outside use. Many other amenities. 018 
LAKE LEON: 2 BR, 2 bath home on 3 waterfront lots. 
CH/CA, satellite. Guest house, stg., fruit/pecan trees, 
garden spot. 024 
LAKE LEON: Be ready for summer! Weekend cabin on 
waterfront lot. Heat A/C. Furnished. 026 
DESDEMONA AREA: 3 BR, 2 bath older frame with 
outbuildings on 3/4 at. Possible owner financing! 025 
CAN'T BEAT THIS! 2BR, 1 bath frame house; perfect 
for handyman. Financing available. 027 
RANGER: 2 for 1112 BR , 1 bath frame home and I BR, 
1 hath home on a large lc t. Excellent investment prop-
erty or live in one & rent arc. 023 

HOUSE & ACREAGE: 
NEAR LAKE LEON -2 BR, 1 1/2 bath mobile home on 
5 acres, Staff water, new cellar. Stove & refrig. HA2 
EXECUTIVE HOM 	 s. Beautifully deco- 
rated. Show place. H 
COUNTRY CHARM! 3 BR brick on 2.7 acres. Bay 
windows, FR; decorator touches, HAl2 
OLDEN: 1 in 	.56 ac.; 3 BR, I 112 baths. 
In need of som 

DREAM COME TRUE home in the country, minutes 
from town! Beautifully decorated 3 BR, 2 bath brick, 
many amenities; workshop.' HAI 
CARBON: 3 BR frame home on 36.5 acres. Cultiva-
tion With quota; minerals. 1-IA24 
100 ACRE PECAN ORCHARD. Highly productive; 
2 homes, farm equipment;23 ac. w/dnp irrigation. 
Good Income! IIA9 
EASTLAND LAKE: Great fishing! 5 acres with 3 BR, 
1-3/4 bath home. City water and satellite. HA13 
COUNTRY CHARM on 10 acres. Beautiful oak trees 
surround this brick 3 BR, 2 bath with CH/CA. HA16 
RANGER: 2 acres with 3BR, 2 bath modular home. 
Pretty setting, trees. Owner fin. to qual. buyer. 11A15 

ACREAGE: 
LAKE LEON: Excellent recreation or building site! 4 
acres, highway and lake frontage, Al 
NIMROD: 139 acres native pasture. Hwy. & county 
road frontage. Nice building site. Some minerals, pro-
ducing well. Al6 
29 ACRES within city limits of Cisco. Highway front-
age, oak trees. A10 
TWO BUILDING SITES: Approx. 3 acres each, with 
water meters. Highway frontage. A5 & A6 
CARBON Arca; II 8.5 acres, fenced & cross-fenced, 3 
tanks & equipment shed. Some minerals. A19 
224 AC. SO. OF CAR BON: Pan brush, approx. 30 ac. 
coastal. 2 tanks, fenced & cross-fenced. Some miner-
als. A20 
320 AC., CARBON:Improved grass & cult. Fenced & 
cross-fenced, 5 tanks. Sane minerals. A21 
16 ACRES on pavement near Eastland. Fenced, beau-
tiful oak trees. Be Quick! Al 1 
296 ACRES North of Cisco - Native pasture with 
highway & county road frontage. 3 tanks; good hunt-
ing. A26 
59.5 ACRES, Highway 80 E, Ranger, across from 
school. Native pasture, great for subdivision! Al2 
155 ACRES So. of Cisco; cultivation, pasture & 
wooded, with deer. Highway frontage. All 
61.8 ACRES so. of Ranger, with paved & county road 
frontage. Producing oil & gas; 1/4 minerals. Al5 
9 ACRES in the city limits! Nice building site. A31 
65 ACRES F.. of Carbon: approx. 21 ac. cult.; paved 
road. Sandy land; some minerals. A7 
160 ACRES NW of Eastland: Approx. 90 acres of 
improved grasses, remainder native pasture with scat-
tered trees; 2 tanks. A9 
327 ACRES W. of Carbon: 75 ac. cult., improved 
grasses & wooded pasture. peanut quota. Al3 
82 ACRES NW of Gorman: Approx. 1/2 cult. Small 
tank, hand dug wells. Minerals. A14 
245 ACRES S. of Carbon: Approx. 67 acres in cult., 
balance in improved ;gasses. Underground irrigation, 
large barn w/ilied. 12 x70' mobile home on property. 
Minerals & quota. A8 
OLDEN: 16 Ac. 	 ome hookup, carport, 
TV antenna, city  soLD 

COMMERCIAL: 
EXCELLENT LOCATION! Store with 1680 sq. ft., 
kitchen,CHICA; 5 dr. spaces w/all utilities,  C7 
FANTASTIC LOCATION next to Skinny's. 145t241  
office bldg.; 60x160 paved & fenced lot. Cl 
ON TILE SQUARE: 2 story bldg. in good location, 
some equip. & booths. Needs some repairs. C4 
CISCO: Excellent office bldg., 5 rooms, 2 restrooms. 
Concrete parking arca. In good location. CS 
CISCO, 1-20: 30 wooded acres, over 500 ft. Frontage 
on North Access Rd., cast of city limits. C6 
RANGER: 2 story bldg., needs repairs. 1st floor open 
area w/restroom & kitchen. C8 
1-20, 25 ACRES, I mile from E. Eastland exit. Beau-
tiful homesite, permanent & overnight trailer spaces. 
Some minerals & production. C9 
CISCO: Beauty shop, 4 station, 8 hairdryers; nice 
interior. Asphalt parking. CIO 
CISCO: Frame office bldg.; 3 offices, reception arca. 
On corner lot. Cl2 
CISCO: Vacant lot, F.. 8th & Ave. C. C13 
CISCO: Mini-mall, over 4,000 sq. ft. metal bldg. on 
main thoroughfare. Cl4 
CISCO: LarI 	g.; concrete floor, office in 
front; 30x50 	 15 

ra 

LNVESTORS! 2 unit apartment complex, I,2&3 BR, 
D/W,washe r/drycr con.,CII/CA; 90% occupancy. C18 
FANTASTIC LOCATION! Ilwy. 80 E. Eastland, 
near 1-20; high volume of traffic. Currently occupied 
as offices. Excellent for retail & expansion. C2 
RANGER: Large garage type building divided in 2 
units, plus a small apartment. C2I 
RANGER: 2 story brick bldg.; 18 offices, reception, 
with large 3BR 1112 bath apartment. Good condition 
& near downtown. C22 
EASTLAND: Commercial lot, approx. 1 ac., Hwy. 80 
E frontage; high traffic volume. C23 
RANGER: 2 story bldg. in downtown Ranger. Great 
location! Good condition! C24 
EASTLAND: Two 2-unit townhouses. Frame w/brick 
trim, C11/CA & appliances. Great investment! C25 

BARBARA LOVE 
647-1397 

SHELLY RICIIEY 	ROSEMARY FERGUSON 
629.3614 	 653-2375 

CINDYE FOSTER 
629-8227 

Itil
Wight & 
Comely 

AIS REAL ESTATE 

Barbara Love, Inc. , 	317 East Main 
Broker 	Ea.stland, Texas 76448 

629-1725 	629-8391 

ANN WILLIAMS 
REAL ESTATE 
610 Conrad Hilton Ave., Cisco 

442-1880 
Business & Home Phone 

CISCO HOMES 
Reduced to $9,81 1 

SOLD  plus detached apt., many 
trees, corner pt.   

Who Says You Can t Afford A Home? Numerous 2 and 3BR 
homes under $12,000., some with owner financing. 

Attention Men! Very nice large insulated shop, large rollup 
doors, many extras, 4 lots, neat 2BR mobile home. 

Only $15,000., neat and clean 3BR home surrounded by oak 

frees, shop, storage bl. fenced yard. 
It's Your's For Only $19,500. - Neat 3BR home, wood heater, 

carport, covered patio, fenced yard, by Elem. School. 

Garden Lovers! 2BR brick energy effec. home, CH/CA, city 
and well water, large trees, 5 lots. 

Handyman's Special, historical 2 story home with basement, 

shop, large privacy fenced yard. 
Need extra lots? Perfect for growing family, 3BR, 2 baths, 

large rooms, 6 lots. 
Bring All Offers! Spacious 3BR, 1 3/4 baths, central heat, 7 

closets, garage, storage, near Elem. School. 
What A Deal! 3BR, 2 	 me, CH/CA, 2 lots, 

possible FHA financial 	 wn, wn, only $27,500. 
Family Delight - 3BR, 11 baths, CH/CA, vinyl siding, storm 

windows, covered deck, garage, carport, 2 lots, $29,500. 
Exceptional Price! Nice 3BR, 13/4 bath, CH/CA, sep. LR, DR 

& den, extra storage, garage, fenced yard, $29,500. 
Just Listed, quiet neighborhood, large 3BR, 2 1/2 bath home, 

great den with fireplace, CH/CA, many extras, patio, car-
ports, shop. 

Immaculate 3BR, 2 bath brick, 2 living, areas, office, CH/CA, 
fireplace, wood heater, patio, carport, nice fenced yard. 

Room To Ramble - Approx. 2700 sq.ft. 4BR, 2 1/2 baths, CH/ 

CA, 2 lots, double carport & storage, assumable FHA loan. 
Enjoy Swimming Year Round in your own indoor heated 

pool! Large 4BR, 3 bath home, CH/CA, fireplace, garage, 
carport, extra storage, possible owner financing. 

Step Into Yesteryear, spacious 3BR, 2 bath Colonial Style, 

formal DR, woodheater in den, large oak trees, workshop: 

A Rarity! 2story II 5BR, 3 1/2 baths, 2 CH/CA 
units, FP, ma 	SOLD 	, orchard, 3 fenced lots. 

Don't Cramp Your Style, Big N' Beautiful 4BR, 3 bath, 2 
living areas, CH/CA, 2 fireplaces, surrounded by oak trees. 

Country Charmer, city conveniences, beautiful 4BR, 2 baths, 
CH/CA, super swimming pool, large shop, garage, city and 
well water, many extras, approx. 1 acre. 

VACANT LOTS - Many to choose from, call for information. 

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY 
Unbelievable! 4 lots with metal building, only $9,500. 

Have your own Business - Warehouse or Office, excellent lo- 
cation on Conrad Hilton Ave. 

Reduced to $69,000.,1 t • • Ir .. • • a restaurant with equip- 

ment and furniture  SOLD 	lot, 1-20 frontage, on 
approx. 2 acres, pric • 	"gotiable. 

SMALL AND LARGE ACREAGE 
Reduced to $18,  SOLD  acres with 2BR, 2 bath, CH/ 

CA, FP, gar t 	 ank, rural water. 

Cozy 2BR rock home, CH/CA, garage, approx. 1800 sq.ft. 
shop, on 5 acres near Cisco, $32,500. 

60 acres, sandy loam, possible 8 3/4% Int. loan assumption, 
only $29,500. 

$350. per acre, approx. 209 acres, just outside city limits, 
mostly wooded, several tanks, rural water nearby. 4.104 

Commodities Distribution 
I.N. (Nute) Hart of Cisco 
and Josh Hart of Fort 
Worth. 

Hart Reunion To Be 
Held This Weekend Tarleton State University 

Announces Honor Roll 
CTO, Inc. has no con-

trol over what items are 
available or the quantity 
of the items. All locations 
of all commodities de-
pends on the availability 
of food items from USDA. 

All eligible persons will 
receive emergency food 
assistance without regard 
to race sex, color, age, 
national origin, or handi-
cap. Shut-ins are encour-
aged to designate an au-
thorized representative to 
pick up for them. 

Volunteers are greatly 
needed and appreciated 
to help with this much 
needed program. 

Friends of th e family are 
invited to drop by for a 
visit. 

The two surviving chil-
dren of I.N. and Katy Hart 
hope to attend; they are__ 

The descendants of I.N. 
(Ike) and Katy Hart will 
hold their annual reunion 
at the Corral Room, 400 
Conrad Hilton Avenue in 
Cisco, Saturday, July 13, 
from 10 a.m. to 4 p.m. 

All relatives are urged 
to come and bring a cov- 
ered dish. 	• 

B,D; Joe Foster B; April 
Shanafelt D. 

MINGUS: Nancy Ear-
nest B,D; Kvin 
Beverly Lawrence B. 

MORAN: Dora Cook 
A,D. 

OLDEN: Holli Burgess 
B. 

RANGER: Kimberly 
Adams A,D; Catherine 
Williams A,D; SherryNail 
B,D; Karen Greenwood 
B,D; Jayne Richey B; 
Linda Wall B; Charles 
Wheeler B; Heather 
Edwards D. 

RISING STAR: 
Brenda Switzer A,D; 
Rhonda Lee B,D; 

Shawnah Harmon B; 
Josephine Hughes B. 

A-A Honor Roll, B-B 
Honor Roll, D-Distin-
guished Student. 

Central Texas Oppor-
tunities, Inc. will distrib-
ute USDAcommodities in 
Eattland County at the 
following locations: 

Cisco: 1611W. Hwy 80, 
July 16, 1991, 8:00 to 
10:00. 

Rising Star: Senior 
Center, July 16,1991, 
12:00 to 1:00. 

Eastland: Senior Cen-
ter, July 17, 1991, 8:00 to 
10:00. 

Carbon: Downtown, 
July 17, 1991, 11:00 to 
11:30. 

Desdemona: School, 
July 17, 1991, 12:00 to 
12:30. 

Gorman: Senior Cen-
ter, July 17, 1991, 1:00 to 
2:00. 

Ranger. Senior Center, 
July 18, 1991, 8:00 to 
10:00. 

Items available this 
month are: flour, rice, 
green beans. 

with no grade lower than 
B and taking a minimum 
of 12 hours. 

Distinguished Students 
include freshmen and 
sophomore students who 
have a minimum GPR of 
3.25 with no grade lower 
than C, and juniors and 
seniors who have a mini-
mum GPR of 3.50 with po 
grade lower than C and 
are in good standing. 

CISCO: Stacy Douglas 
A,D; Stephen Jones A,D; 
Sabina Knight A,D; Debbi 
Pope A,D; Norma Stroe-
bel, A,D;JerryR Hastings 
Jr. B,D; Krista Svendsen 
B,D; Gerry Webb B,D; 
Beulah Annan B; Joel 
Evatt B; Dee A. Jackson 
B; Audrey Wylie B. 

EASTLAND: Keven J. 
Coplen A,D; Natalie D 
Stevens A,D; Melissa 
Williams B,D; Jim An-
drews B,D; Sandra Berry 
B,D; Tracy Edwards B,D; 
Jodee Flippin B,D; Cathy 
Vernon B,D; Robert Hill 
B, Jack Jordan B; Keith 
Henson D. 

GORDON: Tina Mills 
B,D; Cindy Pierson B. 

GORMAN: Darla Files 
A,D; Larry Bryant B,D; 
John Carter B,D; Johnnie 
Barnett B,D; Tina Burney 
B,D; Brandon S. Gilmore 
B,D; Miaheal G. Snider 

The A and B Honor Roll 
and Distinguished Stu-
dent list for the Spring 
1991 semester has been 
announced at Tarleton 
State University. Dr. 
Robert C. Fain, Vice Presi-
dent of Academic Affairs 
at the University, re-
leased the names of stu-
dents honored during the 
spring semester which 
ended in May. Included 
on the list were 246 stu-
dents making the A Honor 
Roll and 911 making the 
B Honor Roll. There were 
865 Distinguished Stu-
dents named. 

Students listed on the A 
Honor Roll must have a 
4.0 grade point ratio 
(GPR) on the 4.0 system 
and be taking a minimum 
of 12 hours. Students on 
the B Honor Roll must 
have a grade point ratio 
between 3.00 and 3.99 

There are 336 dimples on 
an average golf ball. 

USE THE 
'LASSIFIEDS 

It  

MAYNARD REAL ESTATE 
629-8568 Maynard Building, Hwy 80 East, Eastland, Texas 

WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS!! 	 Available Nights and Weekends 

Cisco Press - Eastland 
Telegram - Ranger 
Times - Rising Star 

Thursday, 
July 11, 1991 

• 



REAL ESTATE 

161 A. Lots of bottom land, 60 
tillable; well fenced, 1/2 mi. 
Sabanna, good deer hunting, 
lots big oak, pecans. $550 ac. 
Agent owned. 
80.5 A. 7 mi. NE Rising Star, 
30 coastal, app. 1/2 cutt.,well 
fenced, lots rd. front, $560 ac. 
95.43 A., 20 cult., 3-1 frame 
home, 4 mi. of Carbon. Good 
barn, nativegrasses. $70,000, 
$14,000 down, 10% int. 
62A. M/L, about 1/2 cult. good 
peanut/melon land, some 
coastal, lots road front, with 
new fence. $500 a., liberal 
terms, agent owned. 
70.3 A. 7 mi. E.Hy 36, timber, 
coastal, 3 water taps applied 
for, well fenced, barn, tanks, 
$500 a., cash or equity/GI 
assumption. 
182 A.-Desdemona, most 
native pasture, rolling, liveoak, 
deer, 2 BR frame home, FREE 
nat. gas, barns, corrals, fine 
well, $600 A. 1/4 down. LOTS 
pavement. 
54.35 A.-E. Carbon, most all 
good coastal, near pavement, 
well fenced, good well, 1 tank, 
minerals, $750 A. cash or (9) 
terms. 
App. 1.5 A.-E. Carbon, 2 BR 
frame home, clean, big oak 
trees, small barn, walls insu-
lated, co-op water meter, fruit/ 
pecans, just off hwy. Just 
$20,000. 

We WANT Your Listings 
35 Yrs. in Business 

COGBURN REALTY 
893-666 	893-5898 
893-2642 	DE LEON 

FOR SALE 

MEN'S COWBOY Cut Wran-
glers, 13 MWZ or 936 DEN, 
$16.99, Cowboy Cut in col-
ors, $18.99. Johnson's Dry 
Goods, Cross Plains, 	28 
LAIDIES LEEJeans, sizes 10-
20, yokes and pleats, $29.99. 
Johnson's Dry Goods, Cross 
Plains. 	 28  
2 21-ft. Whirlpool chest type 
freezers, topcondition, $225 
each. Call 643-2815, 25-28  

LORING peaches now ready 
$12.00 per bushel - You pick. 
Dan Childress, 1 mile West; 1 
mile south of Cottonwood. 

817-725-6279 
R30 

LIVESTOCK 
ANGUS BULLS 

FOR SALE 
Breeding age or younger. 

Will also sell pairs 
or heifers. 

James Ratliff 
Ranger, Texas 

Home Phone-647-1667 
Office Phone-647-1260 

RS31 

WORK WANTED 

HOUSECLEANING. Rea-
sonable rates. Call 643-7517 

27-28 

HELP WANTED 

NEEDED RN relief for Sat-
urdays and Sundays, hours 6-
2 or 2-10. Salary competi-
tive. Contact Russell Gray, 
817/643-6700. Rising Sta.! 
Nursing Center. 	rs52 
NEED NURSES aides. Must 
take 80-hr training course to 
be on registry; We will train. 
Salary $4.65 after success-
fully completing course. Con-
tact Russell Gray, Rising Star 
Nursing Center. 81 7/643- 
2691, 	 52 

= 
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Statewide Classified 	Advertising Network 
Advertise in 291 Texas newspapers for $250. 

Reach more than 3 MILLION Texans. 
Call this newspaper for details. 

Sean Frith, Sam Hous-
ton Theatre major, took 
the idea of realistic char-
acterization to the ex-
treme. In order to get a 
feel for the role Sean actu-
ally spent the night on the 
set ofAThousand Clowns. 
That's right friends, when 
we say the Mr. Frith is at 
home on the stage, we're 
not whistling Dixie. Sean 
has created in the charac-
ter Murray Burns a fasci-
nating, exciting, heart- 

warmingpersonality. See 
Sean Frith, Le Jones, 
Angel Cochran, Zach 
Thomas, Lloyd Parish and 
many more in the Hilton 

Dinner Theatre's produc-
tion of A Thousand 
Clowns. 

For reservations call 
442-2598 (Mon.-Th urs) or 
442-1351 (Fri.-Sun.) 

Dessert performances 
are July 8, 9, 10, 14 and 
cost is $6.50. Dinner per-
fomances are July 11, 12, 
13 and cost is $12.50. 

AUCTIONS 

FDIC AUCTION 

	 11111EIS 

ACTION REALTY 
WE NEED LISTINGS!!! 

Equal Housing 
Opportunity 

914-643-6516 
AT RISING STAR: 
First time on market. Nearly 
10 acres. 2-story house, lots 
of barns, 3 BR, 1 b, carpeted. 
Call today! 
Handy aroundjiktle house? 
This 2 BR 	*ast nook, 
lots of e, So  .eeds a man's 
touch! Sc. 'le acreage. 
3 BR, 2b Corner lot, laundry 
room, fenced garden, well. 
Call for details! 
Car wash! Ready to go! Cov-
ered stalls, new pumps. Main 
highway! 
1 lot for sale. Trees, need to 
see! Hooked for trailer. 
2 lots at Shamrock Shores. 
Just in time for summer! 
First time on market. Close 
to town! Rock house, needs 
some inside repair,large tree 
covered lot, several sheds! 
Priced to sell. Call for details. 

James Smith, Broker 
915-646-0297 

In Rising Star Call 
STELLA WARE 
817/643-3591 

SELLING YOUR Home or 
buying? Call Stella Ware, 817/ 
643-3591, your local real es-
tate agent for Action Realty, 
Brownwood, James Smith, 
broker. 	 52 

Rising tat 
Sells  . 

BBER S -  

4-Wheelers and Motorcycles 

.\,<OEAGLE 
Real Estate 

The Marketing Co, Inc 
n4W 	LL OW, ENIO OR 737:1 • “Si171.113 

rewAremon 

r Andrews Refrigeration 
And Air Conditioning 

Texas license trTALLB004.144, 

Dealer for Rheem High Eff. 
A/C & Heating Systems 

Commercial Refrigeration 

0 
Service & Repair On 

All Major Brands 

d 
Charles Andrews - Owner 
Burkett, Tx 915-624-5544 

narmarnmeanwass A 

American Legion parade float 

New Construction * Add-Ons 
Steel Buildings * Remodeling 

Tape & Bed * Sheet Rock 
Texture * Acoustics 

Construction 
Lynn Hutton 	Jim Ratliff 

817/725-7582 	817 / 643-6464 
Cross Plains 	Rising Star 

• 

Main Street 
Auto Repair 

Open Monday - Friday 8-5 p.m. 
CUSTOM MUFFLER 
& TAILPIPE WORK 

Jackie Palmore - Mechanic 

643-1701 	RS52 

Hwy. 183 	 Rising Star, Texas 

cr•••••••• •11.1.1,41 .0.1 1.1MM•••••••=1. 1Nt 

r 	vacation /Will Be closed May 6-10 Sz 
reopen May 13 

.44 L 	 

OLIVER WEST 
PUMP SALES & SERVICE 

817/643-4683 
Rising Star, Texas 

Complete Systems 
Sold & Serviced 

2 1/2 mi. south of town 

CARPET 
Cleaned, Rest retched 

Piapaired, Sold, Install& 

Scotch Guarding Available 
No charge for moving furn. 

Dub Meador 
anomPiaire 72 5 — 772 0 

CAMPBELL'S 
Cabinet Shop 

& Construction 

817/842-5875 

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS 
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENT 
LILLISTON - KMC 

PLANTERS-DISKS• 
DRILLS-ROLL INu 
CULTIVATORS- 

CHISELS 
SELL OR TRADE 

JSIHNI 

ITT ARK TRACTOR A %MN V WC. 

DELEON 	(817) 893-2061 
COMANCHE (91S) 356-3922 

W I IERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED RS52 

RADIO EQUIPPED TRUCKS 
FOR "FAST FRIENDLY SERVICE" 

1-800-535-7562 
WELLS PROPANE 

Rt. 1, Box 82A 
May TX 76857 
817-259-3204 

Hwy. 37 :E Bo:. -425 
Comanche. TX 76442 

915-356-2516 

Paul Williams Roofing Co.  
• FREE Estimates • 

• Alt 1Vork Guaranteed • 
• I lot Tar & Gravel Composition • 

• Shingles • • T-Locks • • Wood Shingles • • 
25 Years Experience In Eastland Area 
Paul NVilliams Carbon, Texas 

817-639-2330 
If No Answer call 817-629-1020 RN..)2 

Mobil Oil Products 
All Other Major Oil Brands 

Conoco Oil Products 
We Deliver Bulk Fuel 

Cross Plains Petroleum 
(E.S.E. Inc.) 

P.O. Box 219 6th at Ave. F 
Cross Plains, Tx. 76443 

David and Lenell Sliger 
Managers 

Phone 
(817) 72.5-6582 

We Accept FINA, VISA, Master Card & Discover  ks52  

n e LeOn 
IRRIGATION SUPPLY, INC. 

Route 1Box 22-A, De Leon 
Phone 893-2123 

Zimmatic Pivots • Ag Rain Hard Hose 
Guns • Cornell Pumps and all other 

types of irrigation equipment 
Complete Service And Installation 1•t": 
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Fresh A Thousand Clowns 
to Show at the Hilton 

THANK YOU From Page One - 
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MEET Classitittis W¢11 

asked for salary increasesp 
for his secretary, himself roduce 

Thanks to all my friends 
and neighbors for all the 
calls, visits, flowes and 
food--and especially for 
the prayers--while I was 
in the hospital. A special 
thanks to Darrell Dossey 
for his visits. 

I love you all. 
Lillian Howard 

Guide 
and two other agents. He 
also requested increases 
in auto mileage allow-
ances and office expenses. 
The total increases re-
quested were $4,488. 

At 1:30 p.m. the Com-
missioners met to con-
sider bids for a motorcycle 
siezed by Federal Agents 
from Guy Regan Kincaid. 
This vehicle was report-
edly released to Eastland 
County by a Federal 
Magistrate in Lubbock. 

There was only one bid 
received for the motor-
cycle, and the Commis-
sioners turned it down as 
being far under market 
value. Sheriff Ronnie 
White was authorized to 
dispose of the vehicle at a 
private sale. 

the roof over the County 
Courtroom had been re-
paired, and he didn't ex-
pect it to leak again. Work 
has also been completed 
on floors in the Tax Asses-
sors office, as well as 
general cleaning and pol-
ishing on other floors. 

Richard Robinson said 
that the Department of 
Agriculture sent a varied 
collection of surplus com-
modities this past month. 
There were 600 cases in 
all, and it took two trips to 
haul everything. There 
was cheese enough for 
Ranger and Cisco, alter-
nating with the part of 
the county receiving 
cheese the last time. 

The court heard several 
requests on the 1991-92 
budget. County Extension 
Agent David Tunmire 

Public Notice 

Consumers who won't 
settle for anything less 
than summer's freshest 
fruits and vegetables will 
want a copy of the "Texas 
Fresh Produce Guide." 
handy 60-county listing of 
pick-your-own, on-farm 
and roadside produce 
outlets. 

Compiled by the Texas 
Department of Agricul-
ture, the guide contains 
information on what's 
available, from apples to 
vine-ripened tomatoes, 
directions to sales loca-
tions, days and hours of 
operation and telephone 
numbers. 

For a free copy, write 
the Texas Department of 
Agriculture, Domestic 
Market Development, 
P.O. Box 12847, Austin 
TX 78711. 

BIDS will be taken on a Po-
table Miller Roughneck 
Welder with generator and 
leads. No bids under $500. 
Bids will close on August 1 
and will be opened at the 
August 12 regular Rising Star 
School Board meeting. 27-28  

. ClaSsified AdS in  , 
The 

Rising-Star • 
GET RESULTS 

Rising Star High School Cheerleaaders 

WHAT'S SO DIFFERENT 
about the Happy Jack 3-X 
flea collar? It works!!! For 
dogs & cats! At Farmland & 
Double Circle Co-Ops & bet-
ter feed stores. 

MOBILE HOME BUYERS. 
Drive a little save a lot. 
FUQUA clearance sale. 
Save thousands $$$$$. 
Best built in Texas. Visit 
FUQUA Factory Outlet. 1-
800-899-0440. 

SHARE AMERICA! Walls 
must fall! Deadlines near! 
AISE Exchange Students 
await family call for Au-
gust. 31 countries/local 
representative. Just food, 
bed, sharing! Exciting! Re- 
warding! 	Relevant! 
Lifetime! 1-800-SIBLING. 

AUTO LOANS!! No credit 
check, no down payment. 
Guaranteed Approval. 
1987-1991 models. 1-800-
235-4487. 

1991 PALM HARBOR 
doublewides-5BR/3BA 
only $34,900!! 4BR/2BA 
only $29,900!! 3BR/2BA 
only $24,900!! Visit the 
factory, save thousands, 
FREE factory tours. Lib-
eral financing. Call 
1-800-880-SAVE. 

DIETS DON'T WORK. 
Body Wise does reduce 
body fat, increase energy, 
lower cholesterol. Call 1-
800-457-4099 for free 
information, no obligation. 

NEED CASH??? Receiv-
ing mortgage payments? 
We buy owner financed 
mortgages locally and na-
tionwide. Ask for Donna at 
Diversified Funding Corpo- 
ration 	today!!! 	Call 
1-800-950-4112. 

A WONDERFUL FAMILY 
experience. Australian, Eu-
ropean, Scandinavian, 
Japanese high school ex-
change students arriving in 
August. Become a host fam-
ily/American Intercultural 
Student Exchange. Call 1-
800-SIBLING. 

LAND BONANZA! 4% in-
terest on Texas forfeited 
land. Average 10 acres, $0-
down, $92-monthly for 360 
months. All areas. 
Homesite, getaway, hunt-
ing, investment. State 
authorized agent. 1-800-
275-REPO. 

FIRST CLASS MACHIN-
IST, engine lathe, horizontal 
boring mill, CNC lathe and 
Bridgeport mill. Benefits: 
Group insurance, retire-
ment, profit sharing. Mark's 
Machine Co., Inc., 409-
543-9204, El Campo. 

COVENANT TRANS-
PORT. Hiring tractor trailer 
drivers; •1 yr. O.T.R. expe-
rience;•Single19-22c;•East 
coast pay; -Incentive pay; 
*Benefits package; •Mini-
mum age 23; •Teams 
27-310. 1-800-441-4394. 

WILL KIT. PREPARE your 
own personal will includes 
living will $12.95. Consumer 
Services, 2010 Loy Lake 
Rd., Suite 134. Sherman, 
Texas 75090. 

TRANSITS, LEVELS, 
THEODOLITES, laser lev-
els, distance meters, 
rolatape measuring wheels, 
vinyl flagging quality wood 
stakes, safety vests 
calbration, repair, free esti-
mates. Easy Drive 
1-800-369-9322. 

DALKON SHIELD USERS 
- Need assistance? Experi-
enced Dall:cn Shield 
attorney. Call Charles John-
son toll-free for free 
consultation. 1-800-535-
5727. 

WE REPLACE ALL front 
tractor tires with triple-
strength aircraft tires, 98% 
flat-free. 1-800-828-3350. 
GENSCO (Since 1946), 
4300 Old Spanish Trail, 
Houston, TX 77021. 

NEED VENDING LOCA-
TIONS? Call a reputable 
customer service com-
pany. We locate all types 
of equipment nationwide. 
Don't leave equipment in 
your garage. Call Premier: 
1-800-937-2627. 

HILL COUNTRY THREE 
room cabin on 53.3 acres in 
Kerr county. Part of a 3,000 
acre estate. Lots of exotic 
game. Only $64,000. Phone 
409-584-2448. 

"CALL US YOU'LL like us! 
Full time mom, devoted 
dad, grandparents, aunts, 
uncles, cousins, love, 
laughter, security, subur-
ban home, await newborn. 
Expenses paid. Call col-
lect 914-761-5174. 

SERVICES 

35 Texas Properties 
Residential, Commercial & Land 

July 11 • 7:30 pm 
Brownwood Holiday Inn 

515 N. Commerce 

Rising Star Properties: 

18 	Hwy 36 East: From Int. of 
Man st & Hwy 38 go 1/4 mile 
east. 2 bed, 1 bath, 989 sq. h. 
SFD 

19 	204 South Miller: A very 
nice 2 bed, 1 bath, brick SFD 
located on a 100x150.5 ft. lot. 
1515 sq. h. 

20 	103 W. College: Large 2 
story brick building. Apx. 9920 
sq. ft on .149 acres 

21 	106 N. Main: Two story 
building. Apx. 4320 sq. ft brick 
commercial budding 

22 	412 N. Main: SFD, 970 sq. ft 
2,bed, 1 bath on a 110x195 ft. 
lot 

23 	411 W. Pioneer 2 bed, 1 
bath, 1008 sq_ tt. SFD on 2 loft 

24 	403 E. Mill St.: 3 bed, 2 
bath, 1344 sq. ft double wide 
ocated on a 175x225 11. lot 

WILLIE VANDIVERE 
Dirt, Caliche Hauling 

Build Driveways, 
Lease Roads, Etc. 
9-5 Call 643-2023 

After 5, 643-6451 

SERVICES 

LEGAL NOTICE 
The City of Rising Star 

is now accepting Bids for 
Auditors for the fiscal year 
1990-91. Mail bids to : City 
of Rising Star, P.O. Box 
35, Rising Star, TX 76471. 

July 3, 1991 
SANITARY IMPROVE-

MENTS 
TO WHOM IT MAY 

CONCERN: 
Notice is hereby given 

by the City of Rising Star, 
Texas to Jim Snodgrass, 
his heirs, assessors or 
assigns and/or the own-
ers of Tract 2, Block 6, 
W.W. Anderson Survey, 
Abstract 1425, City of 
Rising Star, Eastland 
County, Texas, also de-
scribed as 306 E. Pollock, 
Rising Star, Texas, that a 
nuisance exists on said 
property, in that an un-
covered well exists in such 
condition as to render the 
above described premises 
potentially injurious or 
dangerous to the human 
life. If such nuisance is 
not abated within ten (10) 
days, the City of Rising 
Star may remedy such 
nuisance and charge the 
expenses 	incurred 
thereby to the owner of 
the property and/or as a 
lien against the property. 

CITYOF RISINGSTAR 
s/By Shirley Leonard 
City Secretary 

THE RISING STAR 
104 N. Main Street 

Box 127 817-643-4141 
© 1991 Eastland County 
Newspapers, Inc. Publication 
no. (USPS 46650) Second 
class postasge paid at Rising 
Star, Texas under Act of 
Congress March, 1870. Pub-
lished every Thursday. Pub-
lishers, Mr. and Mrs. H.V. 
O'Brien. 
Subscription rates per year: 
Eastland Co. and in a 30-mile 
radius of Rising Star,$9; other 
Texas counties, $13; out of 
Texas, $19. No out of U.S. 
without APO. 
POSTMASTER: Send ad-
dress change to The Rising 
Star, Box 127, Rising Star, 
TX 76471. 

For more information 
1-800-346-05 02 

Cisco Radiator Service 
207 E. 6th - Cisco 

Cleaning, Rodding and Repairing Radiators 

EXPERIENCED ELECTRICIAN 
Can Rewire Houses 

Make Minor Elec. Repairs 

Will do handyman work, some plumbing. 

Small engine repair, most engines. 

643-1117 	28 

Plastic. 	Quality Guaranteed Work 

Call 442-1547 CES104 

       

       

  

REBUILD 
ENGINES 

Aluminum 
Welding 

JAKE'S SHOP 
GENERAL MECHANICAL 

& WELDING FABRICATION 

AUTO 
TRANSMISSION 

  

   

Body Work & Pointing 

  

  

OWNER 
JAKE LANDESS 817-643.3031 

404 N MAIN 
RISING STAR, TX 

rs52 

  

       

       

 

Home Phone 643-4236 
	

Gasoline & Diesel 

CAREY'S AUTOMOTIVE 
Open Mon. - Fri. 	7:30 am. - 5:30 p.m. 

Sat. 8 a.m. - 12 Noon 

James Carey, Mechanic 

Hwy. 36 E. 	 Rising Star 
Shop Phone 643-7009 	

RSK 

 

as- samaiseatiarrs-,s-scassorer_t-ineestetrasareasowayar awassaarttaaastsisausnavinassauansaataaasitart 



Rising Star 4th of July 
Freedom Festival Parade 

Photos by Melanie Barton 
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Actors William Baldwin (L) Kurt Russell (center) and Scott Glenn (R) 
are joined by real-life Chicago fire fighters Cedric Young (second from 
left) and Kevin Casey (second from right) who have supporting roles in 
the film "Backdraft." This film will appeal to anyone who has an interest 
in firefighting. 

'Backdraft' To Show At 
Majestic This Weekend 

Pharmacy 

By Bob Mueller 

Alpha-interferon, one of the earliest biotechnical 
marvels, has received approval from the Food and 
Drug Administration for the treatment of widely 
prevalent hepatitis C. Brand name is Intron A. 

*** 

Lecithin is being tested to see if it will prevent 
cirrhosis of the liver due to heavy alcohol consump-
tion. Tests have been conducted on baboons, ac-
cording to a report in the Journal Hepatology. Test-
ing in humans may follow. 

*** 

People who walk at least 21/2 hours a week arc less 
likely to have high cholesterol than those who don't, 
stud ies'found at Brigham Young University in Provo, 
Utah. 

*** 

Eye medications are more effective if you shut your 
eyes for a few minutes after use, says the chief of 
opthalmology at the Ireland Community Hospital 
at Fort Knox, Kentucky. If you keep your eyes open, 
natural blinking is more likely to wash the medica-
tions away. 

*** 

You'll always get good advice from the pharmacist 
at Wal-Mart Pharmacy, Hwy. 80 East, Eastland, 
629-3347. 

cershIM 

DON'T MISS 
A WORD! 

"I wear eye glasses because they 
help me to SEE BETTER." 

"I wear hearing aids because they 
help me to HEAR BETTER." 

"IT'S AS SIM I'LL AS THAT''" 
CLINTON HEARING CENTER 

721 Conrad Hilton Ave. 
Cisco, Texas 

CALL (817) 442-2168 NOW! 
556 

YOUR 
HEARING 

TEST 
IS 

FREE 

"INCREDIBLE AND EXCITING. 
I DON'T KNOW How THEY DID IT!" 

Y.,11.n.,1,11,1M1Y/ 

"THE PERFORNIANCES ARE OLTSTANMING!" 

"STIRRING AND EMOTIONAL! 
Enough ckchrencnt for a ',hole summer full of minim! 

• D.rm.( •••••e,ft a"..1 
7 

I., 	KURT RUSSELL-WILLIAM IIALDWIN- SCOTT GLENN 
JENNIFER .DLSON LEIGH • N:: BOCA DEMORNAY 

DONALD SUTHERLAND AND ROBERT DB NIRO 

BACKDRAFT 
10M1F IneVOROAL,_, 

	 01111(,11t1S1L WV SUNOS. fIc 

MAJESTIC THEATRE 
629-1322 

UNIVBSAL STUDIOS HOLLYWOOD 

Fri. • Sat. • Sun. • Mon. 
All Shows: 7:30 p.m. - 

We Now Offer 5-Admission Gift Passes - $10 

Air Conditioner Repair 

Pin 
Striping 

Welding 

Fiberglass 
ALL WORK GUARANTEED 

FREE ESTIMATES 

Owner KYLER KNIGHT 17 yrs. Experience 

442-1366 
Across from Ted & Rex's 5 61 

r1

..........................„„..........,...,............ 1. 
0-   s'. 	KYLER ' S 449- .,..„,,, .0. 

PF1MT B BODY 
North Hwy 6 Cisco 

111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111 

Saturday, July 13, 1991 10:00 A.M. 
1108 South Seaman Eastland, Texas 76448 

The Following Items of the Vera Woodard Estate 
Will Be Sold At Public Auction: 

Zenith Remote Control T.V. 
GE Frost Free Refrigerator 
3 Piece Bedroom Suite 
2 Piece Bedroom Suite 
Platform Rocker 
2 Marble Top Tables 
Card Tables with Chairs 
Kitchen Stool, Luggage 
Pole Lamps, Vanity Stool 
Magazine Rack 
Record Cabinet 
Twin Bed 
6 Foot Step Ladder 
Small Chest Type Freezer 
Kenmore Washer/Dryer 
Dearborn Heater 
Early American Love Seat 
Several Nice Lamps 
Handpainted Pictures 
Microwave Oven 
Small Electrical Appliances 
Silverware, Radios 

Maple Droplcaf Table 
with Chairs 

Coffee Table 
Drum Table, Swag Lamps 
Gold Trith Mirrors 
Scatter Rugs 
Desk and Chair 
Stereo, Vases, Dishes 
3 Chest of Drawers 
Bath Room Stool 
Bath Room Scales 
3 Tier Mirror Table 
Bedding, TV Trays 
Yard Tools, Fishing Tackle 
Panasonic Vacuum 
Ice Cream Freezer 
Singer Sewing Machine 
Occasional Chairs 
Francisan Pottery 

Dinner Ware 
Cooking Utensils 
Telephones 

Plus Many Other Related Items - -
Don't Miss This One! 

Auctioneers Note. ''This Is One of the Finest Groupings Ever Sold 

James T. Wright 	 Jim Wright 
WRIGHT AUCTION CO. 

Bonded - Insured 
Bus. Ph. 817-629-2468 
Res. Ph. 817-629-1074 

102 So. Seaman St. Eastland, TX 7C448 
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Gaines Automotive 
Hi Tech Care For Hi Tech Cars 

Don't Leave Town 
TRY US FIRST! 

Instead of taking your car out of town for repair, bring it by here first. We 
have over 20 years experience in the auto repair business and brand new 
state of the art equipment to make your car run like it is supposed to. 
Next time your car needs repair. 

State Inspection Station 
314 W. Main 
	

Eastland 
	

629-1008 

3 2 5 14- 

8 9 

April Texas Gas Production 
Up Compared To 1990 

The firefighting movie 
"Backdraft" has been out 
only six weeks, but it is 
already acclaimed as one 
of the most authentic 
picture about firemen 
ever made. For "Back-
draft" was shot right on 
location in Chicago, with 
members of the City Fire 
Department playing some  

of the parts. 
This Universal picture 

will show at the Majestic 
Theatre in Eastland Fri-
day, July 12 through 
Monday, July 15, with 
curtain time at 7:30 each 
evening. Tickets will be 
$3 at the box office. 

The film's title refers to 
a dangerous phenomenon  

that occurs when flames 
consume all the oxygen 
in a room, leaving only 
unburned natural gases. 
With the temperature 
still approaching two 
thousand degrees Fahr-
enheit, the introduction 
of the smallest trace of 
oxygen can trigger a vio-
lent explosion. This is the 
darkest nightmare of any 
fireman. 

In the middle of all the 
excitement of"Backdraft" 
is Kurt Russell, William 
Baldwin, Scott Glenn, 
Jennifer Leigh, Rebecca 
De Mornay, Donald Suth-
erland and Robert 
DeNiro. The script was 
written by former fireman 
Greg Widen, and filmed 
with the full support and 
cooperation of the Chi-
cago Fire Department. 

Along with thefirefight- 

Cisco Press - Eastland 
Telegram - Ranger 
Times - Rising Star -
Callahan County Star 

July 11, 1991 
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Just Fishing 
Around 

Twenty four pounds of 
bass in two fish, what a 
catch. Two lucky anglers 
landed one 13 pound plus 
and another the next day 
11 pounds plus and both 
fish came from a hole of 
water not much larger 
than a stock tank, Lake 
Pioneer. Both are believed 
to be either Fl or FX(pure 
Florida or Florida native 
cross). Many anglers h ave 
stated their surprise in 
the pressure of the Flor-
ida strain in this lake. 

Florida's are every-
where folks. Many farm 
ponds are stocked with 
Florida's and with heavy 
rains smaller fry are 
moved down to the next 
hole. Also early after 
being stocked many an-
glers began moving the 
Floridas around to waters 
not blessed with them. 
Even though this prac-
tice must first be ap-
proved by TP&WD offi-
cials due to the chance of 
moving diseases. If you 
are planning a trip to 
Pioneer, release those 

ing is the story of two 
brothers struggling to 
carry on the legacy oftheir 
heroic father, and to come 
to terms with his tragic 
death. But most of all 
"Backdraft" deals with 
the commitment and sac-
rifice of men who make 
firefighting part of their 
daily lives. 

MOBILE 
HOME 

TRANSPORTING 
Complete Moves 

& Setups 

Moving 
Throughout Texas 

• Tie Downs 
• Blocking 

& Leveling 

* Licensed 
* Bonded 
* Insured 

18 Years Experience 

817-893-6753 
5-104 

Grandpaw's 
Tool Shed 

Rental 
Grinder Turns 

Yard Waste To 
Garden Mulch. 

Takes limbs up to 
3" in diameter 

1304 E. Main 

Eastland 

Travis Chapman 

629-3363 

lunkers, unless your plan-
ning to put one on the 
wall. And even then a 
fiberglass replica will last 
you a lot longer and most 
even look better. 

Bass fishing at Lake 
Leon continues to be slow 
with a few fish being 
taken in 15 feet of water 
on worms. If you will 
watch your depth finder 
you will see most of the 
bait fish seem to be at this 
depth. Leons channel cats 
are bitting on nightcrawl-
ers and cut shad. Perch 
fishing is great also so 
load the kids up and let 
them have it. 

Eastland lake is turn-
ing out a few channels 
itself on grasshoppers. 
Bass fishingis fair on dark 
worms, shallow. 

Lake Brownwood Crap-
pie anglers are still catch- 
ing nice limits with live 
minnows in main lake  

brushpiles. The hybrid 
strippers are fair using 1 
ounce white hair jigs 
during the day and on 
slug-go's at daylight and 

dark. Black bass fishing 
has been slow with a few 
fish coming on crankbait, 
and jigs in red colors. 

Lake Proctor still seems 
to be healing slowly after 
last year's near disaster-
ous flood. Crappie are fair 
in the main lake point 
brushpiles. Black bass are 
good to four pounds on 
jigs in 3 feet of water, 
black and white seem to 
be the best colors. The 
catfishing at night is pick-
ing up on live shad drift 
fishing in the dam area. 

A simply summer time 
worming trick that has 
produced a few fish. Take 
any worm, place a small 
nail in the head, insert 
hook in the middle push-
ing it out the other side 
then simply insert the 
hook tip near the tail. This 
still gives your plenty of 
action and also places you 
in the position to hook up 
with there short bites. 

Railroad Commission 
Ch airman Lena Guerrero 
announced that Texas oil 
and gas wells produced 
439,585,175 Mcf (thou-
sand cubic feet) of gas in 
April, up 1.31 percent 
compared to April 1990's 
production of433,881,253 
Mcf. The March gas pro- 

Plenty of fluid is the 
rule with our summer 
heat. Carry water, fruit 
juice and athirst quincher 
like Gatorade. Water 
alone will not keep you 
going in these Texas 
fryers while your "Fish-
ing Outdoors." 

Terry Wilson 

duction total was 
457,250,107 Mcf. 

The state's top produc-
ing counties, rank ordered 
by preliminary April pro-
duction, were: Pecos, 
27,194,752 Mcf; Zapata, 
23,452,785 Mcf; Webb, 
22,955,792 MCf; Panola, 
16,548,020 Mcf; Hidalgo, 
15,824,369 Mcf; Crane, 
11,902,695- Mcf; Hem-
phill, 9,168,6-18 Mcf; Yoa-
kum, 8,729,870 Mcf; 
Crockett, 8,549,469 Mcf; 
and Ector, 8,322,559 Mcf. 

Texas gas production in 
April came from 187,701 
oil wells and 46,427 gas 
wells. 
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Fishing Outdoors 
by Terry L. Wilson 
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89 Hyundia, 5 speed, air, 1 
owner, new tires 	$3650 

88 Chevy Celebrity, auto, 
air, cruise, AM/FM, 1 owner, 
nice car 	 $3995 

88 Yugo, 1 owner, air, 
stereo, 39,000 miles, 
nice car 	 $1595 

83 Olds. Delta 88 Royale, 
Brougham, 4 door, fully 
loaded 	 $2550 

86 Escort, 5 sp., air, 
60,000 act. miles, 
nice car 	 $1995 

88 Escort EXP, 
low miles 	 $4395 

85 LTD, 4 door, air, 
automatic 	 $2250  

85 GMC Sierra Classic 
Pickup, fully loaded, auto, 
air, nice truck 	$4350 

88 Ford Tempo, 2 door, auto, 
air, cruise, extra nice car, 

1-20 MOTORS 
Rt. 2, Box 226A 

Cisco,Texas 
(817) 442-2161 

52,000 miles 	$4350 

Lake Cabin South Side Lake Cisco. 
Other Cars To Choose From. 

85 Ford Tempo, 2 door, auto, 
air, cruise, good work 
car 	 $1795 

80 Chevy Van, Captain 
chairs, loaded 	$3500 

87 Ford, 4 door, 
Taurus 	 $4550 

89 Chevy Cavalier 
Wagon 	 $4995 

89 Ford Tempo, 4 door, auto 
and air, 60,000 actual miles, 1 
owner, extra nice 	$4950 

89 Mercury Topaz, 4 door, 
auto & air, extra nice, new 
tires, 52,000 miles 	$4950 

90 Ford Festiva LX, 5 sp., w/ 
air, 31,000 miles, AM/FM, 
stereo, 1 owner 	$3995 

89 Subaru, 2 door, auto 
w/air, extra nice, 
1 owner car 	 $3750 

85 Ford Pickup F150, auto & 
air 	 $3750 

A-1 BUILDERS 
Building & Remodeling 

- ROOFING 
- SIDING 
- METAL BUILDINGS 
- PLUMBING 
- ELECTRICAL 
-CONCRETE 

Commercial * Residential 

Jerry Maston • Owner 629-8148 

• 
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Childers Auto 
Friendly Service At A Price 
You Can Afford. We Service: 

* Auto Transmissions 
* Air Conditioner Service 

* Complete Exhaust Systems 
* Computerized Tune Ups 

* Front End Repair & Alignment 
* Brakes & Suspension 

& Much More 

(Great Prices Every Day!) 

Mechanics - Bill Fee & Jaret Singleton 

1401 Conrad Hilton „„ 	442-3373 

The Rising Star 

Contel To Begin 
Business as GTE 

Thursday, July 11, 1991 

State Tax Expert Will 
Be in Eastland July 19 

"Hello, this is GTE, may 
I help you?" This is a typi-
cal greeting customers 
will get effective August 1 
as all Contel telephone 
operations nationwide, 
with the exception of 
Contel of California, be-
gin doingbusiness as GTE 
Telephone Operations. On 
this date, GTE will begin 
to change all of COntel's 
visible corporate identifi-
cation to the current GTE 
logo. This include such 
items as signage on build-
ings and public tele-
phones, stationery, busi-
ness cards, telephone 
bills, vehicles and even 
company flags. 

"Although the name 
may be changing, Contel 
customers can expect GTE 

to continue to offer the 
highest level of quality 
telecommunications serv-
ices available," said Kent 
B. Foster, president of 
GTE Telephone Opera-
tions. "The combined 
companies will do an even 
better job of serving cus-
tomers by taking advan-
tage of our combined re-
sources." 

How big a job is it to 
change over the Contel 
name to GTE? Well, for 
example most of the 4, 226 
buildings, 6,356 vehicles, 
21,000 public telephones, 
and approximately 15,000 
paychecks will sport the 
GTE logo by the end of 
1991. Changes at all loca-
tions should be completed 
by mid-1992. 

Contel of California, 

which is not changing to 
the GTE name, includes 
all of Contel's local ex- 
changes in California, 
Nevada and the western 
half of Arizona. Also not 
changing to the GTE 
name is the former Con- 
tel Western Region head-
quarters in Bakersfield, 
California. 

GTE Telephone Opera-
tions, the largest of GTE 
Corporation's three busi-
ness groups, provides lo-
cal p 

hone service through 
18.4 million access lines 
in portions of 40 states 
and two foreign countries. 
In addition, GTE Tele-
phone Operations mar-
kets telecommunication 
products and services 
internationally; and sup-
plies computer software 
and data processing na-
tionwide. Revenues in 
1990 totaled $15.4 billion. 
GTE Telephone Opera-
tions has approximately 
114,000 employees. 

explain which state taxes 
apply to your particular 
business and send you 
home with useful infor-
mation," Sharp said. 

Eastland area taxpay-
ers who won't be able to 
meet with Royce Manning 
can receive individual tax 
help by calling the 
Comptroller's statewide, 
toll-free assistance hotline 
at 1-800-252-5555. 

Or, they can contact the 
Abilene Enforcement Of-
fice at 915/695-4323. The 
Abilene Enforcement Of-
fice serves taxpayers in 
Brown, Callahan, Cole-
man, Comanche, East-
land, Erath, Fisher, Has-
kell, Jones, McCullough, 
Mills, Mitchell, Nolan, 
Runnels, San Saba, 
Scurry, Shackelford, 
Stephens, Stonewall, Tay-
lor and Throckmorton 
counties. 

The public will have the 
opportunity on Friday, 
July 19, to meet one-on-
one with a state tax ex-
pert in Eastland, when a 
representative from the 
State Comptroller's Office 
visits the Eastland Coun-
ty Courthouse. 

"Not everyone can get 
to Austin or to one of our 
field offices for tax assis-
tance. So we periodically 
visit county courthouses 
as a service to Texas tax-
payers," State Comptrol-
ler John Sharp said. 

Royce Manning, from 
the Comptroller's Abilene 
Enforcement Office, will 
be in Room B10, (Social 
Security Room) at the 
courthouse from 10 to 11 
a.m. 

"We'll be happy to sit 
down with you and fill out 
your sales tax return, 

Courthouse 
Report  

New Cars from May 1 
through May 15 

Chev., Fullen Mtr. Co., 
Eastland, 90 PU, Chev. 
Mtor. Div. 

Ford, Kenneth Stroud, 
Cisco, 91 PU, Hood King 
Mtr. 

Chev., Olen W. Cren-
shaw, Ranger, 91 PU, 
Fullen Mtr. Co. 

Ford, Cheryl/Charles 
Robinson, Cisco, 91 PU, 
Hood King Mtr. 

Ford, James Liles, Al-
varado, 91 PU, Hood King 
Mtr. 

Chev., Jimmy Burns, 
Gorman, 91 PU, Fullen 
Mtr. Co. 

Ford, James E. Dunn, 
Cleburne, 91 PU, Hood 
King Mtr. 

Ford, Guy E. Busk, 
Cisco, 91 4dr, Hood King 
Mtr. 

Ford, David W. Ste-
wart, Eastland, 91 2dr, 
Hood King Mtr. 

Chev., Karen Mangum, 
Eastland, 90 PU, Fullen 
Mtr. Co. 

Chev., Amy Michelle 
Putnam, Ft. Worth, 91 
PU, Fullen Mtr. Co. 

Ford, Fernando L. 
Maldonado, Eastland, 91 
PU, Pierce Mtr. Co. 

Ford, B. B. Alexander, 
Eastland, 91 2 dr, Hood 
King Mtr. 

Ford, Robert Joe Her-
ring, Eastland, 91 PU, 
Hood King Mtr. 

Buick, Dr. H. J. Bul-
gerin, Eastland, 91 4 dr, 
Caldwell Mtr. 

Chev., D. D. Crawley, 

The following proceed-
ings were had in the Court 
of Appeals, Eleventh Dis-
trict of Texas: 

Ford, William E. Can-
ner, Eastland, 91 PU, 
Pierce Mtr. Co. 

Buick, Pearl Elizabeth 
Trapp, Cisco, 90 4 dr, 
Caldwell Mtr. 

Chev., Kip G. Smith, 
Hawley, 91 PU, Fullen 
Mtr. 

Chev., Sandra H. 
Brown, Ranger, 91 blz, 
Fullen Mtr. 

Chev., Terry Wilson, 
Corinth, 91 2 dr, Fullen 
Mtr. 

Chev., Tina Hopper, 
Abilene, 91 PU, Fullen 
Mtr. 

Chev., Wendy High, 
Dallas, 91 PU, Fullen Mtr. 

Dodge, J. W Ramsey, 
Palacios, 91 4dr, Bagwell 
Mtr. 

Ford, Alton D. Mitch-
ell, Eastland, 91 PU, Hood 
King Mtr. 

GMC Kerry W. Watson, 
Eastland, 91 PU, 
Caldwell Mtr. 

Chev., Robert Bryan 
Orms, Eastland, 91 PU, 
Fullen Mtr. 

GMC Jim R. Fleming, 

Abilene, 91 PU, Caldwell 
Mtr. 

Pont., Angela Kay 
Lambert DBA, Eastland, 
90 3dr, Caldwell Mtr. 

Chev., Frances Hol-
stead, Cornith, 91 sub., 
Fullen Mtr. 

Chev. GMAC do Scot 
Edington, Burkett, 91 PU, 
Fullen Mtr. Co. 

County Clerk 
Marriage License 6-

13-91 
Chriss H. Timmons, Jr. 

and Marialyce Pope. 
Bobbie Glen Ferguson 

and Cindy Kay Walke. 
Ronnie Pitt Walton and 

Donna Mae Justice. 

Ranger, 91 PU, Fullen 
Mtr. Co. 

May 15 through May 
31 

Ford, Dickey R. War-
ren, Spicewood, 91 PU, 
Pierce Mtr. Co. 

Ford, Bruce L. Wil-
liams, Baird, 91 PU, 
Pierce Mtr. Co. 

Pont., Margaret F. 
Bearman, Eastland, 91 4 
dr., Caldwell Mtr. Co. 

Chev., Clovis W. 
Putnam III, Arlington, 91 
PU, Fullen Mtr. Co. 

Ford, J. T. Scarlett, 
Cisco, 91 fl, Hood King 
Mtr. 

Buick, Richard K. 
Nunley, Odessa, 92 4dr, 
Caldwell Mtr. 

Chev., Donna Imsade, 
Eastland, 91 2 dr, Fullen 
Mtr. 

Ford, Wilmer C. Cole, 
Big Spring, 91 PU, Hood 
King Mtr. 

GMC, Jim R. Wright/ 
Sneed Construction DBA, 
Eastland, 91 Jimmy, 
Caldwell Mtr. 

Ford, Roger F. Mat-
thews, Millsap, 91 4dr, 
Pierce Mtr. 

Ply., Tom B. Smith, 
Cisco, 91 2dr, Bagwell 
Mtr. 

Ford, Wilmer C. Cole, 
Big Spring, 91 PU, Hood 
King Mtr. 

Ford, A. C. Reid, 
Ranger, 91 PU, Hood King 
Mtr. 

Chev., James/Joetta 
Schuman, Eastland, 91 
cpe, Fullen Mtr. Co. 

Jeep, Pat Steward, 
Ranger, 91 4dr, Fullen 
Mtr. Co. 

Chev., Russell Verner, 
Eastland, 91 PU, Fullen 
Mtr. Co. 

Kristoffer Noah Rhein-
gans and Kristina Mich-
elle James. 

Michnel Ray Sharp and 
Dawn Michelle Wilson. 

Jesse Alan Anderson 
and Belinda Donee' 
Bradford. 

James DeWayne Reger 
and Dorothy Jean Pen-
nington. 

Edward 	Andre 
Stephens and Corena 
Prichard Hill. 

Criminal Docket 6-
22-91 

The State of Texas vs. 
Sheldon Lee Bryars -
Criminal Trespass. 

The State of Texas vs. 
George 	Serene 
McCormick - DWI, 2nd 
offense. 

Look up before 
you climb up! 

Locate overhead 
power lines before 
you start any outdoor 
project that requires 
a ladder or long- 
handled tool. Work 
only in dry weather 
and never on 
a windy day. 

of Texas. 
Appellant' s motion for 

extension of time to file 
brief. - Taylor. 

11-91-074-CR 
Terry Eugene Barney v. 
State of Texas. 

Appellant' s motion for 
extension of time to file 
brief -Taylor. 

11-91-090-CV 
Doris Carter Corum, In-
dependent Executrix of 
the Estate of Harry 
Lee Carter, Deceased v. 
Exxon Corporation. 

Agreed motion to extend 
time for filing appellants' 
brief. 

Appellants' counsels' 
motion to withdraw as at-
torneys. - Cherokee. 

11-91-091-CV 
Michael and Juanita 
Dowler v. Delta Invest-
ment Housing, Inc. et al. 

Appellants' motion for 
extension of time to file 
brief. 

Appellants' motion to 
supplement transcript. - 
Upshur. 

11-91-094-CR 
Maurice Moody v. State 
of Texas. 

Appellant's motion for 
extension of time to file 
statement of facts. -
Gregg. 

11-91-103-CR 
Charles Welborn Gore v. 
State of Texas. 

Appellant' s motion for 
extension of time to file 
statement of facts. -
Smith. 

MOTION SUBMIT-
TED 

& GRANTED IN 
PART 

11-91-008-CR Ivory Joe 
Walker v. State of Texas. 

AFFIRMED 
11-90-080-CR Curtis 

Calvin Yarbrough v. State 
of Texas. 

(Opinion by Judge 
Brown sitting by as-

. signrnent) 
(Judge Dickenson not 

participating) - Harris. 
11-90-089-CR 

Nathaniel Lawrence Ray 
v. State of Texas. 

(Per Curiam Opinion) 
(Judge Arnot not par-

ticipating) - Harris. 
1 1-90-090-CR 

Nathanal Ray v. State of 
Texas. 

(Per Curium Opinion) 
(Judge Arnot not par-

ticipating) - Harris. 
11-90-144-CV 

Sue Haynes, Independent 
Executrix of the Estate of 
Sue Nelson 

Stripling v. Hays Strip-
ling, Sr. 

(Opinion by Judge 
McCloud) Publish - How-
ard. 

11-90-158-CV 
Employers' Insurance of 
Wausau, a Mutual Com-
pany v. Lawrence S. 
Martinez. 

(Opinion by Judge 
Dickenson) - Howard. 

11-90-164-CR 
John Todd Vanderhorst v. 
State of Texas. 

(Opinion by Judge Dick-
enson) 

(Judge Arnot not par-
ticipating) - Erath. 

11-90-170-CV 
Jack Jones and Jacky 
Jones v. Polly Jo Baitz. 

(Opinion by Judge Dick- 
enson) - Stonewall. 	• 

11-90-184-CR 
Johnny Jimenez v. State 
of Texas. 

(Opinion by Judge 
Brown sitting by assign-
ment) 

(Judge Arnot not par-
ticipating) - Taylor 

11-90-252-CR 

The State of Texas vs. 
Jacqueline Ann Murk -
Theft by check, $20.00 or 
more but less than 
$200.00. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Leroy Jason Morris -
DWI. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Max Young Squires, Jr. -
DWI. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Richard Dwaine Gaeta, 
Ricky Don Reynolds -
Assault causing bodily 
injury. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Johnnye Ray Broom -
DWI, 2nd offense. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Katherine Stalcup Crys-
ler - Theft $20.00 or more, 
but less than $200.00. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Chris Dane Crenwelge -
DWI. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Johnny Robert Whis-
enant - Possession of 
marijuana, 2 ounces or 
less. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Mark Nolan Little - Pos-
session of marijuana, 2 
ounces or less. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Jennifer Lynn Dillard -
DWI. 

The State of Texas vs. 
Jesus Lorenzo Hernandez 
- DWI. 

District Clerk 6-13-91 
Nora Edith Elizalda vs. 

David P. Elizalda - Di-
vorce. 

Sammy R. Ritchey vs. 
Joe Edwards - Default 
loan payment - appeal 
from JP #2. 

Donna Faye McCafferty 
vs. Daniel Kelly McCaf-
ferty - Divorce. 

Gorman Milling Co., 
Inc. vs. Ted Scarbrough -
Suit on account. 

In the interest of A.S., a 
child - Parent-child rela-
tionship. 

Pamela Kay Grimes vs. 
Billy Ray Grimes, Jr. -
Family protective order. 

Tammie Laine Alexan-
der vs. James Roger Al-
exander, Jr. - Divorce. 

Norman L. Carey vs. 
Mary Margaret Carey -
Divorce. 

Donna Ann Jones vs. 
Randy Dwayne Jones -
Divorce. 

Remember, 
keep a safe 
distance from 
power lines and 
make sure 
that equipment 
has ample 

\ clearance! 

Appellant's third mo-
tion for extension of time 
to file brief. - Taylor. 

MOTIONS SUBMIT-
TED & OVERRULED 

11-90-161-CR 
Kenneth Elwood Narron, 
Jr. v. State of Texas. 

Appellant's motion for 
rehearing. - Palo Pinto. 

11-90-162-CR 
Kenneth Elwood Narron, 
Jr. v. State of Texas. 

Appellant's motion for 
rehearing. - Palo Pinto. 

11-90-215-CV 	' 
Jack Bryant v. Charlie V. 
Gamblin. 

Appellant's motion for 
rehearing on order alter-
ing supersedeas bond. -
Brown. 

Clemmie Johnson a/k/a 
Clemmie Wickware v. 
State of Texas. 

(Per Curiam Opinion) 
(Judge Arnot not par- 

ticipating) - Fisher. 
REVERSED & RE- 

MANDED 
11-90-107-CR Christo-

pher Johnson v. State of 
Texas. 

(Opinion by Judge 
Brown sitting by assign-
ment) 

(Judge Dickenson not 
participating) -Grimes. 

MOTIONS SUBMIT-
TED 

& GRANTED 
11-90-056-CR 

Robert Lee Murphy v. 
State of Texas. 

Appellant's third mo-
tion for extension of time 
to file brief. - Harris 

11-90-074-CR 
John P. Worthy, Sr. v. 
State of Texas. 

State's motion for ex-
tension of time to file brief. 
- Harris 

11-90-106-CR 
Randall Berkefeltv. State 
of Texas. 

State' s motion for ex-
tension oftime tofilebrief. 
-Brazoria. 

11-90-195-CR 
Danny Joe Patmore v. 
State of Texas. 

Appellant's fourth mo-
tion for extension of time 
to file brief. - Jones. 

11-90-258-CR 
James Jasper White v. 
State of Texas. 

Appellant's third mo-
tion for extension of time 
to file brief. - Scurry. 

11-91-043-CV 
Kenneth Sanders, Indi-
vidually and d/b/a Ken-
neth Sanders Invest-
ments v. Damon Garvin 
d/b/a Circle D Oil Field 
Specialties. 

Appellant's motion to 
supplement transcript. 

Appellant's motion for 
extension of time to file 
brief. - Shackelford. 

11-91-065-CV 
Freedom Bank, DeLeon, 
TX, Bob Leach and Joe K. 
Moore y. Wayne May 
Enterprises, Inc., d/b/a 
Brownwood Cattle Auc-
tion. 

Appellant' s (Freedom 
Bank) second motion for 
extension of time to file 
statement of facts. -
Brown. 

11-91-069-CR 
Samson Sanchez v. State 

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY 

An Equal 
OPPoremity 
Employer 

A Member of The Central and South West System 

Remember REDDY Supplies the energy —
but only YOU can use it safely! 

New Construction * Add-Ons 
Steel Buildings * Remodeling 

Tape 0 Bed * Sheet Rock 
Tenture * Acoustics 

Itica tiomtiliroiti106w 
Lynn Hutton 
	

Jim Ratliff 
817/725-7582 
	

817/643-6464 
Cross Plains 	Rising Star 



Thursday, July 11, 1991 

Engagement Announced 

Lisa Chambers and Bryan Switzer 

T-L Irrigation Co. 
Center Pivot, 

Hydrostatic Drive 
Can Be Moved 

In Minutes 
Sales and Service At 

Buddy's Plumbing 
& Appliance  

112 N. Main 	 Rising Star 

817-643-7312 	KS 2•CE 1 04 

FARM 
BUREAU 

INSURANCE 
•	 

"Protection. No doubt about it. Our 
agent helps us plan just the coverage we 
need. And they helped me develop a 
financial strategy for the future: Now 
my retirement years can be restful 
years. No wonder Americans from 
every walk of life depend on Farm 
Bureau Insurance.- 

Helping You Is 
What We Do Best. 

FRANK AGNEW 
817/643-1010 
817/629-1704 

"Why Farm Bureau 
life insurance?" 

Shurfine 

Corn W/K 
16 oz. 

2/$1.00 

Shurfine 
Cut Green 

Beans 
16 oz. 

2/$1.00 

Shurfine 

Towels 

59 

 

  

Tomatoes 

69 lb. 

Pepsi 
2 liter 4►  

PEPSI 

99 ton 

Shurfine Halfmoon 
Horn Cheddar 

8 oz. 

$1.29 
Strawberries White Onions 

13 
• 

3 ibs./$1.00 

Green 

Cabbage 

19 

* Look for in store everyday low prices * 
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Main St. 	 Rising Star 	 643-2221 

Sale Wed. July 10-Sat. Jule 13 

Freedom Festival, Rodeo Christy George Attends 
Workshop at Texas Tech 

The Rising Star, 

Star Pride 
Volunteer 
of the Week 

Al Jones has vol-
unteered his time and 
equipment to keep 
the Goss Monument 
property looking 
good. Thank You Al 
from Star Pride. 

Where oh where 
have the weeds all 
gone, 
Where oh where 

Joy Harris was the 
Star Pride volunteer 
who sprayed weeds 
in the downtown 
area prior to July 4. 
The weed killer was 
donated to Star Pride 
by Winfrey Feed & 
Peanut Co., Inc. 
Thank you, Joy, for 

a job well done. 

TSU's 
Honor 
Roll 

The honor roll and dis-
tinguished student list 
for Tarleton State Uni-
versity inside this issue 
does not include the 
name of Howard Law-
rence, B Honor Roll. 

From Page 1 ... 

ber of Commerce with 
Stephanie Jobe, Miss 
Gorman; Kaylyn Porter, 
Little Miss Gorman; Pea-
nut Festival 1991; 2. 
Comanche Chamber of 
Commerce with Misty 
Salter, Miss Comanche; 
Amanda Griggs, Jr. Miss; 
Amy Sandervol, Little 
Miss; and Jamie Jo 
Roming, Petite Miss; 3. 
Peoples State Bank with 
Oepration Desert Pride 
theme. 

Other entries included: 
Rising Star Roping Club 
with Tara Donham, 
Christy Hubbard, Jo Dell 
Hubbard and Jacki Hub-
bard riding; Allen and 
Winnie Hines (78 and 79 
years of age) of DeLeon 
riding paints; Charles 
Hall of Rising Star on 
horseback. Lee Roy Rose 
with a covered wagon 
pulled by mule and don-
key. In the motorcycle 
division were Dedria 
Emert of Rising Star on 
Honda 4 wheeler; Harold 
Zink ofGorman on Suzuki 
(Cross Timbers Wind 
Riders); Stacy Swafford of 
DeLeon on Yamaha 850 
special (Cross Timbers 
Wind Riders); Ivon Cagle 
of Clyde on Kawasaki 
Voyager XII. 

Also entered in the an-
tique cars division were 
Pat Vaughn fo Eastland 
in '34 Ford; Wayne Bailey 
in '67 Chrysler convert-
ible; David and Lenell 
Sliger of Cross Plains in 
'57 2-door Post; The Ole 
Store in Old Car. On bi-
cycles were Vyron Fun-
derburk, Jerald Harris, 
Jessica Harris, Steven 
White, Carla Fun derburk. 
On a float was "Country 
Music a Texas Tradition" 
with Carl Whiteley from 
Cisco and the Country 
Express band. Other 
floats were American 
Legion Post 433 of Rising 
Star; Eastland County 
Crime Stoppers in truck 
with "Legends of the 
West" from Cisco. Driver 
was Terry Edwards, 
Crime Stopper Board 
Member, and the "Leg- 
ends of the West" were 
Joe "Longarm" Williams, 
Roger "Bobcat" Woodall, 
Eddie "The Kid" Woodall 
and Ronald "Buffalo" 
Bennett. Also on floats 
were Betty Jo Jones, Miss 
Rising Star; Stephanie 
Sizemore, Runner-up  

Miss Rising Star; Star 
Pride; The Saturday 
Club's Happy Birthday 

USA_ 
Rising Star EMS had 

two ambulances in the 
parade; Rising Star Rural 
Fire Department '78 Ford 
6x6 (driver Bruce Rivers) 
and '85 Chevrolet (driver 
Donnett Nall); Sipe 
Springs Fire Department 
in fire truck driven by 
Rocky Reisner; Winfrey 
Feed & Peanut Co. Fertil-
izer Truck driven by Jerry 
Winfrey; Cook's Fish Barn 
BBQ Pit. 

Walking in the parade 
were Rising Star High 
School Cheerleaders, 
Head, Jo Linney; Ass't. 
Head, Gherda Williams; 
Sec., Heather Wright; 
Treas., Athena Black; 
Reporter, Inga Williams; 
and Rising Star Jr. High 
Cheerleaders. 

Judges for parade were 
Haney Sides, Harold 
Adcock, Bob Richardson, 
Leslie Vance, Gene Moore. 

The ice cream judging 
contest benefited Rising 
Star Emergency Medical 
Service (EMS). Winners 
ofthe prizes were 1. Edith 
Bibb, Milky Way, $50; 2. 
Barbara Kanady, Straw-
berry, $25; 3. Dorothy 

The annual Cisco Jun-
ior College "Drive-In Band 
Camp" will be held in the 
Fine Arts Building dur-
ing the first full week in 
August. Classes to be of-
fered during the camp are 
as follows: rhythm, the-
ory, section rehearsals, 
band rehearsals; along 
with some recreation each 
day. A stage band class 
will be offered if enough 
students are interested. 

The Drive-in Camp is 
open to any student with 
at least one year of band 
instruction and any stu-
dent through the 12th 
grade is welcome to at-
tend, whether their band 
director is on staff or not. 

Classes will begin at 9 
a.m. each day, and will 
conclude at around 4 p.m. 
Lunch will be furnished 
atthe college cafeteria and 
the camp will conclude 
with a swimming party 
and cook-out at the City 
Park on Friday, August 
9th. 

A Fee of only $50 per 
student will be charged 
for the camp, and this will 

Lakewood Golf Course 
has a 3-Person Scramble 
Tournament scheduled  

Maxwell, Peach, $15. Real 
winners are all who bene-
fit from the volunteer 
ambulance 	service! 
Thanks to all entrants for 
your part in helping the 
EMS. 

The large crowd really 
enjoyed the music July 4. 
On hand to entertain were 
Jerry Walker of 
Brownwood, Rudy Stark 
of Llano, Johnny Clower 
of Pontoc and Thomas 
Kent of Mason; Earl Epley 
of May; Laysern Wilburn 
of Burkett; Bill Millican 
ofcArbon; Gene Christian 
of Coleman and Earl Hill 
of Brownwood; Carl 
Bludworth of Burkett; 
Wendell Bailey of M&y; 
Smokey Callawy of cot-
tonwood; W.B. "Dad" 
Bludworth of Burkett; 
Geraldine Richter of Ris-
ingStar; and Carl Whitely 
and the Country Express 
of Cisco. Members of the 
Country Express are Ben 
Cozart, Erric McClintoc, 
Zack Thomas, Chris 
Reeves, Leslie Reeves and 
Jesse Reeves; they are 
under the tutelage of 
Whitely. Some of the 
musicians did not regis-
ter and their names are 
not available. 

Results of the rodeo will 
be in next week's issue. 

include all activities, 
meals each day, camp t-
shirt, daily awards, and 
also on Friday we will 
award outstanding tro-
phies for the best junior 
high and senior high stu- 

dent as selected by the 
camp staff. Along with a 
beautiful trophy, each 
recipient will be given free 
tuition to our camp next 
year. 

Instructors for the camp 
will be area band direc-
tors. Bill Swinney, CJC 
Band Director, will also 
instruct and be in charge 
of the camp. The purpose 

of the "Drive-In Band 
Camp" is to help students 
get prepared for the com-
ing school year, and to get 
to know students and di-
rectors from other com-
munities. 

Students should meet 
in the CJC band hall on 
the second floor ofthe Fine 
Arts Building at 9 a.m. on 
Monday, August 5. Regis-
tration will take place at 
that time, and a full day of 
instuction will follow. 

for July 20-21. Entry fee 
will be $60 per person 
which includes mulligans, 
contests, and the meal. 

Tee off times are 8:30 
a.m. and 1:30 p.m. Satur-
day and Sunday. Golf 
carts will be available or 
you may bring your own. 

There will be a Longest 
Drive Contest on hole No. 
4 and Closest to the Pin 
on hole No. 8. A prize of 
$50 will be given for each 
contest. Cash prizes are 
awarded to the top three 
tournament winners in 
each flight. 

The meal of Fish with 
all the trimmings will be 
served at 7:30 p.m. after 
play on Saturday. Plates 
will be $5 each for club 
members. 

Deadline for entries is 
Friday, July 19. Call the 
Pro Shop at 643-7792 to 
enter. 

Christy George has just 
spent two weeks at Texas 
Tech University, partici-
pating in a program of-
fered by the Tech Insti-
tute for the Gifted called 
Shake Hands With Your 
Future. The program of-
fers classes in Art, Mete-
orology, Aerodynamics, 
Theatre Arts, Psychology, 
and many areas of inter- 

The 4th of July 
Scramble was a lot of fun. 
We had 46 players which 
made up 8 teams. Rich-
ard Taylors team won 
with eleven under par. 
John Ely and Richard 
King's team tied with nine 
under. John won it with a 
playoff on the card giving 
Richard third place. There 
isn't enough room to list 
all the players but we're 
glad you all played and 
hope you come back 
Thursday. 

Coach Kyle Coker won 
the Closest to the Pin on 
the last hole of the day. 
He had a shot of 19 ft. 6 in. 
from the flag. 

We want to thank Alma 
King for the chips, dips, 
and cookies she had set 
up Thursday. We do ap-
preciate all you do for the 
club Mom. 

This week we'll have the 
regular 9 hole Thursday 
scramble. Tee off will be 
at 6 p.m. You don't have 
to be a member to play. 
Come on out and join us. 

The fishing has also 
been good at Lakewood 
lately. Two weeks ago a 
man from Merkel caught 
a bass weighing 13 lbs. 
That same day David 
Merryman caught an 8 
pounder. Last week an 
Abilene man caught an 
111b. bass. There must be  

est to gifted students. 
During her stay, 

Christy attended classes 
in Law and Computers. 
In her Law class, they 
explored all the different 
areas encompassed by the 
law, viewed an actual trial 
and then staged mock 
trials in order to under-
stand more fully what a 
lawyer does in the court-
room. During on of these 
trials, Christy served a 
ProsecutingAttorney and 
won her case against the 
accused. 

In COmputers, Christy 
learned about Data Bases, 
Spreadsheets, Work Proc-
essing and other facets of 
computers. 

Christy is the daughter 
of Chuck and Linda 
George of Rising Star. 

some pretty bigfish in that 
lake and right now they're 
biting. If you don't play 
golf you can come out and 
fish. 

Don't forget the 3 per-
son Tournament next 
weekend. Get your team 
together and start prac-
ticing. 
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Drive-In Band 
Camp at CJC 

3-Person Golf 
Tournament 

Lakewood News Mr. and Mrs. R.D. 
Chambers of May have 
announced the engage-
ment and approaching 
marriage of their daugh-
ter, Lisa, to Bryan 
Switzer, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Lonnie Switzer of 
Cross Plains. Lisa is a 
1991 graduate of May 
High School and is cur-
rently employed by Ole 

Rip Cap Co. ofRisingStar. • 
Bryan is a 1983 graduate 
ofRisingStar High School 
and is currently employed 
by McGinn Construction 
Co. of Rising Star. The 
wedding is planned for 
August 16 at 7:00 p.m. at 
the First Baptist Church 
of Rising Star. Rev. Dick 
Williams will officiate. 
Friends and family are 
invited to attend. 
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