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Progress Is - 

Making Good Things 

Happen 

WHERE THREE GOOD 

TEXAS COUNTIES 

GET TOGETHER 

NOTICE 
The First State Bank of 

Rising Star will be closed on 
Monday, February 16, in ob- 
servance 	of 	George 
Washington's birthday. 

Birthday 

Greetings 
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The Man Who Believed 
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Senator Creighton Seeks 
Re-election 

an 

The old Star Theatre building was destroyed by fire on Saturday af-
ternoon. (Photo by Edra Butler. 

Star Theatre Destroyed By Fire 
THERESA SCOTT WITH "FUZZY" - - the Chianina - Angus cross -
bred steer that took the reserve championship at the Fort Worth Stock 
Show. 

MINERAL WELLS - - State 
Senator Tom Creighton today 
formally announced for re -
election in the 17 - county 22nd 
Senatorial District declaring 
opposition to increased taxes in 
the 65th Legislature to convene 
in January, 1977. 

"The impact of inflation on 
'the taxpayers dictates that our 
state government hold spen-
ding within available tax 
revenues," Creighton said. 
"This can be accomplished 
barring a fiscal catastrophe", 
the senator stressed, noting 
that official forecasts are that 
the state will start the next 
session with a $428.2 million 
surplus. 

"At next year's legislative 
session, there will be a real 
premium upon experience and 
calm, unhurried judgment," 
said Creighton who was first 
elected to the Senate in 1960 and 
is now fourth ranking member 
of the 31 - member body. "A 
careful and deliberate ap-
praisal of all state programs 
will be esssntial", he said. 
"That I will do." 

Theresa Scott Wins Reserve Champion chTalitem212annd DOfstri ttieSen;enra:se 
Economic Development 

Winning is not a new experi-
ence for Theresa Scott, 16 year 
old member of the Eastland 
County 4-H Club, but she says 
that every show is just as 
challenging and every champ-
ionship is equally exciting. 

Theresa, the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Payton Scott, is a 
junior in Rising Star High 
School. At the Southwestern 
Exposition and Fat Stock Show 
in Fort Worth in January. 
Theresa won Reserve Champion 
in the steer competition with 

entertainment for area 
residents who paid the sum of 
ten cents to see a movie, and 
five cents for a bag of popcorn_ 

Mayor C.M. Carroll has 
stated that the city will assume 
responsibility for clearing 
away the charred ruins of the 
building. 

The structure is said to have 
been built in the early twenties, 
the theatre itself has through 
the years been under several 
different managers, to name a 
few, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Await, 
Mr. and Mrs. Welch and Mr. 
and Mrs. H.L. Killion. 

Time was when the Star 
Theatre was the center of 

A reminder of the past was 
destroyed on Saturday af-
ternoon when the building, 
which formerly housed the Star 
theatre, was destroyed by fire. 

Cause of the fire is not 
definitely known, but it is 
thought to have caught from a 
grass fire on an adjoining lot. 

Beta Upsilon 

Celebrates Birthday Flag Presentation Set 
For March 2 

"Fuzzy" a Chianina-Angus 
cross. The steer brought $3,300 
in the show auction, this price 
was second only to the top bid of 
$7,600 paid for the Grand 
Champion ster which was 
shown by Sherry Koenig of 
Cross Plains. 

Interestingly enough, the 
champion steer was bred by 
Payton Scott and was purchased 
by Dick Koenig in a special club • 
calf sale at the Scott Ranch, 
north of Rising Star. 
In 1974 Theresa showed 

another cross breed, this time a 
Maine-Anjou, at the Houston 
Livestock Show, which was 

4 Lakewood Plans 

Game Night 

selected grand champion of the 
show. This steer brought 
$40,000 at the Houston auction. 
However Theresa is not the only 
member of the Scott family with 
show-ring prowdness, her two 
younger brothers Neal and Sam 
have taken their share of 
honors, most recently in the 
Fort Worth Show. 
Neal won a first and a 6th in the 
Carcass competition with a 
Santa Gertrudis and Sam an 8th 
with a Maine-Anjou, and a 9th 
place with a British cross. 

Theresa is showing this week 
in the Southwestern Inter- 
national Show in San Angelo. 

Members of the Lakewood 
Ladies Association will meet on 
Tuesday, February 17, at 7:00 
p.m. for a game night. 

Games of 42 and canasta will 
be played in the Recreation 
Center. 

Local Students Make 
C.J.C.'s President's List 

Notice 

saved area taxpayers millions 
of dollars, although the local 
share was left too high", he 
said. 

Creighton also is a strong 
supporter for agriculture and 
rural Texas. 

During his first twelve years 
in the Senate, Creighton has 
been chairman of the important 
Water and Conservation 
Committee, Privileges and 
Elections Committee and, for 
the past four sessions, he has 
served on the Appropriations 
subcommittee and the Senate -
House Conference Committee 
on Appropriations. 

Creighton and his wife, the 
former Sue Sparks, reside in 
Mineral Wells where lie is a 
practicing attorney. Their 
three sons, Will, Kenny and 
Mark, are all in college at this 
time. 

The 22nd Senatorial District 
's composed of . Bosque, 
Comanche, Cooke, Denton, 

"a'astland, Erath, Hill, Hood, 
Jack, Johnson, Montague, Palo 
Pinto, Parker, Somervell, 
Stephens, Wise and Young 
Counties. 

In making this an-
nouncement, the veteran 
Senator said, "I believe that 
my re- election will prove to be 
of the utmost benefit to our 
District because of my past 
experience, seniority and 
knowledge of the needs of our 
district." 

Committee and is vice chair-
man of the Senate Finance 
Committee with chief 
responsibility to prepare the 
Senate's proposed state budget. 
He also is a member of the 
Senate Natural Resources 
Committee and the Legislative 
Budget Board which, between 
sessions, reviews budget 
requests from all state agen-
cies. 

"The high mark of the last 
legislative year", Creightori 
said, "was the people's defeat 
of State Constitutional 
revision" which he opposed as 
too much of an overhaul at one 
time of the people's basic 
charter. Creighton also fought 
for a more equitable public 
school financing system, 
successfully supporting a lower 
rate of ad valorem taxes to be 
paid by area taxpayers than 
proposed in the original bill. 
"Trimming down the rate 

Three Cisco Junior College 
students from Rising Star 
made 	the 	prestigious 
President's List at the Cisco 
Junior College during the fall 
semester of 1975. 

Teresa Lawrence, daughter 

of Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey 
Lawrence; Sharon Wilson 
Moore, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Clayton Wilson; and Mary 
Norman. 

Students must maintain a 3.0 
grade point average to qualify 
for the President's List. 

Beta Upsilon, Chapter of 
Delta Kappa Gamma Society, 
composed of Eastland and 
Callahan counties celebrated 
its 39th birthday Saturday, 
February 7, with a salad lun-
cheon in the Lakewood Country 
Club Room. 

Mrs. Conrad Schaefer, 
retired Cisco teacher, con-
ducted the scholarship drive. 
Mrs. C.P. Marshall of Eastland 
gave a tribute to the founders in 
her presentation of "Forty 
Candles". 

The hostesses Mesdames 
Raymond DeBusk, Melvin 
Shook, Roy Stambaugh, Conrad 
Schaefer, Lindsay Tyson, 
Roland Nichols and Miss 
Isadore Grimes, carried out the 
Bicentennial theme. 

Sixteen members of Beta 
Upsilon attended. 

The flags will be on per-
manent loan to the Academy 
where they will be on public 
display for an indefinite period 
of time and will be available to 
the City of Rising Star for 
further use during this 
Bicentennial year. 

The flags will be presented to 
Colonel Russell 0. Fudge, 
director of the Academy, in a 
program on March 2, in the 
Rising Star High School 
gymnasium. The presentation 
is expected to involve a number 
of local people, including 
students from both high school 
and grade school, the Com-
munity Singers and others. 

Further information con-
cerning this event will be made 
available at a later date. 

The 76 historical flags, which 
were used in the "Kaleidoscope 
of Frnedom", Rising Star's 
Bicentennial production, are to 
be placed on display in the 
Academy of Freedom in 
Brownwood 	- - this 	an- 
nouncement from Mrs. Carl A. 
Smith. 

Mrs. Smith and several co -
workers, painted the various 
state emblems on the flags, and 
they were sewn together, then 
mounted on standards for 
display in the July 4 program, 
which was coordinated by Mrs. 
Smith and James Steel with the 
cooperation of the 1976 - 76 
senior class of Rising Star High 
School. 

Election Notice 

The Rising Star Clinic will be 
closed on February 12,13, and 
14. The doctor will be out of 
town. 

Eastland County 4 - Her's 
Planning Session Begin Foods Projects 

Validation Stickers Available 
Bank Holiday Slated 

After completion of six 
lessons under adult supervision 
the members are eligilbe to 
participate in the County Food 
Show, set for March 6, in the 
TESCO Reddy Room. They will 
be graded on a possible 100 
points as to knowledge, 
preparation and presentation. 
The theme for this year's show 
will be "Heritage Foods". 

NOTICE OF JOINT ELEC- 
TION 

APRIL 3. 1976 
Rising Star 

City and School 
Two vacancies on Board of 

Education 
Two vacancies on City 

Council. 
Filing date is 30 days prior to 

election date. 

The divisions for entries are 
Breads and Desserts, Main 
Dishes, Snacks and Beverages, 
and Side Dishes. 

Winners in County com-
petition will go to Stephenville 
for the District Food Show. 

For further information 
contact your County Extension 
Office, 629 - 2222. 

Eastland County 4- Hers are 
beginning foods projects this 
month in preparation for ac-
tivities and contests in 
February and March. 

Girls and boys enrolled, ages 
nine through 19 are involved in 
three project levels: Level I - -
Rookies in the Kitchen; Level 
II - - Food, What's It All 
About; and Level III - - the 
Changing Food Scene. Housewarming 

Abraham Cats Fall 

In District 

There will be a housewar-
ming at the new home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Clinton Wilson on 
Saturday, February 14, 1976, 
from 7 to 9 p.m. 

Friends and neighbors are 
cordially invited. 

Hostesses 

At a recent meeting of the 
Rising Star Chamber of 
Commerce, Owen Aikin, 
minister of the local Church of 
Christ, was named chairman of 
a steering committee to lay 
plans for a Bicentennial project 
for this community. 

A planning session for this 
purpose has been set for 
Thursday night, February 12, 
at 7:30 in the Community Room 
of the First State Bank. 

All interested persons are 
urged to attend this important 
meeting. 

FEBRUARY 11 

Janna Hubbard 
Sandy Clarke 
Jerrell L. Harris 
Tracy Couch 

FEBRUARY 12 
Kelly Harris 
Skeet Clark 
Jerry Dean Allen 

FEBRUARY 13 
Beverly Stuart 
Johnny Mac Cook 
Theo Boyd 
Ellie Elliott 
Sharon Dawn Cannistraci 
Lloyd Gonzales 
Fay Medley 

FEBRUARY 14 
Billie Jean Pell 
Steve Hollis 
Ruby Ballew 
Mrs. J.M. Alford 

I. 	Sherry Weaver 
Lee Weathersby 
Lydia Shults 
Donna Beth Rodgers 

FEBRUARY 15 
Mary Hoard 

FEBRUARY 16 

stickers and keep the same 
registration numbers. 

Opening February 1, the 
vehicle registration season 
continues through March. The 
new stickers must be affixed by 
midnight April 1 or drivers will 
be subject to arrest and 
penalties. 

Vehicles must be registered 
with the county tax assessor -
collector of the county of the 
owner's residence. Most 
counties operate substations 
where registration fees may be 
paid. 

Vehicle owners received 
computerized three - part 
registration forms for their 
vehicles by mail during 
January. All that is needed for 
registration is to bring the 
three - part form and the 
registration fee to the county 
tax assessor - collector's office 
or to one of the many sub-
stations that will be in 
operation 	during 	the 
registration season. 

Vehicles can be registered by 
mail through the month of 
February by sending the 
registration form, the fee, plus 
$1 (per vehicle) for handling to 
the county tax office. Owners 
should allow at least 30 days for 
delivery. 

It's 	"something 	old, 
something new" for most 
Texas License plates now. 

The something old is 'the five 
- year license plate issued in 
1975 already mounted on the 
vehicle. The plates were 
designed to last for at least five 
years, being made with more 
durable materials than the one 
- year plates issued in earlier 
years. 

The something new is a red, 
white and blue validation 
sticker to be affixed in the 
embossed rectangle at the 
upper left - hand corner of the 
license plate issued a year ago. 
Affixing the sticker will make 
the plate good for another 
year's driving. 

The new system not only 
saves the State Department of 
Highways and Public Tran-
sportation $8.5 million over the 
five - year period, but it 
relieves the burden of learning 
a new license number for most 
of the state's vehicle owners, 
not to mention the chore of 
removing and replacing the 
entire license tag. 

Holders of personalized 
plates and other special license 
plates will receive a new plate, 
but the majority of Texas 
vehicle owners will receive 

Lincoln The Rising Star Wildcats 
played a game Tuesday that 
will not be soon forgotten. 
Starting two juniors, two 
sophomores, and two fresh-
men, the young Cats came back 
from a 10 point half - time 
deficit to pull ahead by one, two 
times in the final quarter and 
tying it 50 - 50 with less than a 
minute to go. Moran hit two 
with 15 seconds to go to take the 
District playoff. The final score 
was 52 - 50. 

Wednesday Services 

For W. P. Palmore Odessa Services For 

Ottis Adams Jr. 

May Club Hosts Box Supper 

FEBRUARY 17 
Danny Cook 
Marilyn Bibb 
Cherry Lee 
Tom Perkins 
Sarah Pittman 
Amy Davis 

which was sold for $60. 
A total of $260 was received 

from the sale of the boxes. 
Mrs. Mary Michael and Mrs. 

Bea Kelton donated $10 each. 
Reporter, Ludene Michael 

The May Improvement Club 
met on Monday night in the 
club room for a business 
meeting and box supper. 

Marshall Campbell, acting 
president, presided and auc-
tioned the box suppers, one of 

The American 
Dream... 

Ottis Adams Jr., of Odessa, 
died Wednesday morning at 
Medical Center Hospital 
following a short illness. 

Services were held at 4 p.m. 
Thursday at Hubbard - Kelly 
Funeral Home Chapel in 
Odessa with burial in Sunset 
Memorial Gardens. 

Born May 20, 1924, in Okra, 
he married Billie Avalon Green 
April 16, 1949, and was the 
owner of Choctaw Production 
Service. He came to Odessa in 
1941 from DeLeon, was a 
Baptist and an Army veteran of 
World War H. 

Survivors include his wife of 
the home; one son, Mark 
Adams of Odessa; one 
daughter, Mrs. Don Pollard of 
Odessa; his mother, Mrs. 0.0. 
Adams of Rising Star. 

The family requests 
memorials be made to the 
Kidney Foundation of Texas, 
1525 West Mockingbird Lane, 
No. 310, Dallas, Texas. 

Services for William Prit-
chard (Pete) Palmore, 67, of 
Rising Star, a farmer who died 
at 12:05 a.m. Monday at home 
after a short illness, were at 2 
p.m. Wednesday in Higgin-
botham Funeral Home. 

Rev. Johnny Lee, Baptist 
pastor, and Rev. Estelle Allen, 
Methodist pastor, officiated. 
Burial was in Blake Cemetery. 

Born January 4, 1909, in 
Brown County, Mr. Palmore 
married Cleo Henderson July 6, 
1930, in Rising Star. He was a 
member of Pleasant Valley 
Methodist Church and a 
longtime Rising Star resident. 

He is survived by his wife; 
three sons, Jack of Rising Star, 
Carroll of Hobbs, N.M., and 
Jim Ray of Kansas City, Kan.; 
two daughters, Linda Fay 
Cochran of Beaumont and 
Nancy Lee Reneau of Denton; a 
brother, Joe of Dublin; two 
sisters, Mrs. A.B. Sanders of 
Rankin and Sue Kenney of 
Pasadena; and 14 grand-
children. 

1 



tr. 

Merle M Ellis 

Optometrist 
308 Citizens Nat'l Bank 

Building 
Brownwood, Texas 

GLASSES 

CONTACT LENSES 
Call 646 - 8778 

or Write P.O. Box 149 
•••••••••••••••  

••••-•••••••••••••./.~., 4•••••••••••••./.404,4,•• -4•44•14-44,44 

I  

PLUMBING PROBLEMS 
Call Hutchens Plumbing 
Co. for dependable and 
reliable service, reasonable 
rates. Water heaters also 
sold and installed. Licensed 
and Bonded. 

442-3803 
LEWIS HUTCHENS 

Rt. 2, Box 70 
Cisco, Texas 

[2-271 

HAULING 
Sand, caliche and gravel 

R.D. Creech 
Phone 643-3616. 

5-dc 

DON'T LET ANYONE 
TELL YOU TIIAT YOU 
('AN'T 
AFFORD YOUR OWN 
HOME 

Let us show you how our 

financing plan can help you 
turn the dream of a spacious 
new all brick home into a 

living reality! 

Call K. B. Ilomes Collect 
417 - 142-3024 
Nights. 442- 2070 

	'fb 

We have qualified buyers 
for land in this area. If you 
are interested in buying or 
selling contact us at 
anytime. 

Jimmy Partin 

Insurance 

And Realty Co. 
3434 North 6th St. 

Office Phone 673 - 2371 

Alvin Hackteld 692 - 9597 
Venita Raymond 692 - 5244 

The Rising Star Jaycee 
Organization meets on -
Thursday evening at 8:00 in 
the Scout Hut. 

Bob Clark-Pres. 
Ronnie Wilson-Sect. 

Jim Rutherford, Treas. 
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BUSINESS AND PROFESSIONAL 

DIRECTORY 
WANTED FOR SALE FOR SALE NOTICE H.Y. O'BRIEN, Publisher 

MRS. GEORGE STEEL , Editor 
Second Class Postage paid at Rising Star, Texas, under Act of 
Congress on March, 1870. 
Published weekly - Thursdays - by Eastland Comity Newspapers, 
Inc. 

We pity highest prices for scrap 
iron and metal. 

Call us collect for more in-
formation. Ph. 915 - 646 - 7058, 
Brownwood Iron and Metal Co., 
1500 Melwood 37 - tic 

FOR 	SALE--IRRIGATION 
EQUIPMENT--A complete line 
of irrigation equipment. Sub-
mersible, centrifugal and tur-
bine pumps. pipe, fittings. 
volume guns and circle system. 
Let us help you with your 
irrigation needs. Machine Shop 
and parts for pump repair--test 
pit facilities. Also come take a 
look at our Herbicide Chemical 
Applicator for chemical distri-
bution through irrigation lines. 
Largest supply in Central 
Texas. 

KIMMEL IRRIGATION 
SUPPLY, INC. 
HIGHWAY 16 

DELEON, TEXAS 76444 
PHONE 817.893-6266 

FOR SALE - - On South Main 
- - two bedroom house, one 
bath, kitchen - dining room 
combination, single car garage 
with large storage room, plenty 
of closets, large lot with garden 
space. 

Louis A. Mayfield 
Ph. 817 - 643 - 4073 

Associate to 
Don Johnson 

Phone 915 - 646 - 1547. 
7 - tic 

NOTICE--I have several parties 
interested in leasing land for oil 
and gas exploration in the 
Rising Star area. If you are not 
leased, please contact me for an 
offer. Charles Rutherford, Ph. 
643-4581. 29-tfc 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES: In Rising Star and adjoining counties, 
43.00 per year; in Texas, $4.00 per year; elsewhere in the U.S. and 
foreign countries, $7.00 per year 

We arc:- now excepting app-
lications for L.V.N.'s at North 
view Nursing Center in East-
land. Good salary and benfits. 
Contact Mrs. Nix. 401 W. Moss. 
rs-tf 

NOTICE: Anny erroneous reflection upon the character, standing, 
or reputation of any person, firm or corporation which may appear 
in the columns of this newspaper will be gladly corrected upon 
being brought to the attention of the editor. 
All advertising orders are accepted. 

• 

STENOGRAPHER WANTED•-
by Equal Opportunity Employer 
Proficient in shorthand, typing, 
spelling and grammar. Court of 
Civil Appeals, 5th floor, Court-
house, Eastland, Texas. t-96 

FOR SALE - - Small grocery 
store, well stocked, good 
business. Phone 643 - 2492. 7-
tic 

it ... . - . - . - . NOW UNDER CONSTRUC-
TION--3 bedroom, 2 bath brick 
home with central heat and air. 
2 car garage, natural wood 
burning fireplace, built-in kit-
chen appliances, large dining 
area, dressing area in master 
bedroom. Located in exclusive 
Eastland area on large wooded 
lot. Call H&W Development 
Co., 629-1702, for Gary. 48-tf 

... 

• 
J-Ii-%‘,1611,8%31.1%.14A1.,16,NAIMIt., 

• 
ALFORD DRILLING CO. 

Water wells, shallow oil); 
wells, See Tommy or 0  
5C2 rtuic 	 0; Curtis. Phone 817-643-2394 -tf   

.016.Nwolotintookinwoh.•%-t 

Bill's Camera Repair 
Cameras - Projectors - 
Strobes - Light Meters 

4301 South 5th 
Abilene, Texas 79602 

Ph. 692 - 7418 

M. L. TERRELL • 

Fast, Dependable 
Fbi Developing 
Palace Drug Store 

Rising Star, Texas 

Lit ISTAT 1/2  401410'.7 1  ( 
10 FOR SALE - - 450 gallon heavy 

galvanized steel gas tank on 
skids with pump. Ph. 259 - 2196, 
Monroe Chambers, May, 
Texas. 7 - 2tp 

FOR SALE - - I large 3 
bedroom house, 1440 sq. ft. floor 
space on 70' x 120' lot and shop 
building. 25' x 30' on 60' x 120' 
joining lot. 1 small 2 bedroom 
house on 50' x 350' lot. 
Refrigerator and stove, both 
$30. Ph. 643 - 2502, B.P. Un-
derwood, 6 - - 4tp 

WANTED - - John Deere 
Model - A tractor. Phone 259 -
2572. 6 - 3tp 

- HIGHWAY SO EAST 
MONK 429-172S 	NIGHTS 0.1144411 4 
•• 

HOUSES 
"New" 3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick home with central air and 

heat. Home has a fireplace and is in an exclusive addition of 
Eastland. 

Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with central air and heat. Located 
on Seaman Street. $16,800.00. 

Under construction, new 3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick home. Nice 
corner lot. Well financed. 

2 bedroom, 1 bath house on 2 lots, located in Olden. $10,500.00. 
Nice 3 bedroom, 11 2  bath, home with large den, central air and 

heat, location is South Dixie. 
Nice 3 bedroom, 1 bath home, carpeted, with central heat. Good 

location. Shown by appointment only. $21,000.00 
4.bedroom, 3 bath house on Dixie. Shown by appointment only. 
;bedroom, 1 bath carpeted home. Good location. $18,500.00. 
2 bedroom, 2 bath home with fireplace, corner lot on Mulberry 

Street. 
3 bedroom, 2 bath home with fireplace, could be arranged for a 

duplex. 
8 city lots suited for trailer park. $6,500.00. 
6 city lots in Ranger, well located 
Store building, station, living quarters, fixtures and stock at 

Morton Valley, $8,000.00. 
3 bedroom, 134  bath, carpeted, central air and heat, corner lot, 

approximately 3 years old. 
2 bedroom house, completely carpeted and paneled, central 

heat with extra lot. $13,500-00.d 	SMALL ACREAGE 
1 acre with a 3 bedroom, 2 bath, home in Olden. 
2 tracts on Interstate 20 near Cisco, till G.I. 
26 acres near Eastland with city water $12,600.00. 
11 acres with 2 bedroom, rock home extra nice, good barns, city 

water, on pavement, North of Eastland. 
5 acres, 3 bedroom, fireplace, den and 2 bath home, Northwest 

of Cisco. $25,000.00.d 8 acres on Interstate, Ranger, Texas. Good 
location. 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
80 acres Southwest of Cisco, good fences, two stock tanks, and 

half minerals, with a 2 bedroom home, 
163 acres, 3 bedroom home, all coastal, good fences, and barns. 

Located in the Carbon area. $475 per acre. 
668 acres some improved grasses with a 2 bedroom house, good 

barns, good well water, located in Stephens County. 
160 acres Southeast of Ranger, deer and 12 minerals. $300 per 

acre. 
198 acres with 3 bedroom home on pavement with city water, 70 

acres of cultivation near Lake Leon. 
245 acres, 7 miles Southeast of Eastland with city water, 1.2  

minerals, $325 per acre. 
224 acres improved grasses with good fend and good set of 

pens. $10,000 down. Owner will finance. $315 per acre. Location 
near Carbon. 

215 acres near Olden with good fences and good stock tanks. 
491 acres in Eastland County with nice brick home, some 

coastal, fenced and crossed fenced. Approximately 1,2 the 
minerals. Shown by appointment only. 

320 acres near Carbon, 60 acres of coastal, fair fences, 12 

minerals. $315 per acre. 
486 acres near Lake Leon with 2 bedroom rock home, al 

irrigation, and good fences, on pavement. 
695 acres in Eastland County with some river bottom, $315 per 

acre. 
306 acres near Eastland on Leon River with 106 acres coastal 

bermuda and remaining improved grasses, ample irrigation. 
Water and equipment for all of tract. 7 stock tanks, pecan trees, 
good fences, metal corrals and a 40 x 72' all steel barn, also other 
out buildings. 

328 acres in Stephens County. $262.50 per acre. 
320 acres with all improved grasses, good fences, 12 minerals, 

$350 per acre with good terms. 
160 acres with a 3 bedroom home, fireplace, 2 good tanks, 

natural gas, on pavement, city water with some love grass. 
150 acres South of Eastland, 140 acres in coastal, good fences on 

County Road with city water. $425 per acre.d 143 acres Nor-
thwest of Ranger, with 52 acres of peanuts, $375 per acre. 

74 acres with cultivation on County Road North of Eastland 
with city water on pavement. $400 per acre. 

120 acres on Sabanna River, pecan trees, deer and turkey, 12 
minerals. Good terms. 

7 a  4 acrescre . North of Eastland with city water on pavement. $400 

per 	 • 
140 acres close to Eastland with 2 bedroom home, good barns, 

good fences, $450 per acre. 
544 acres with coastal and other improved grasses, good terms, 

some minerals. 
815 acres south of Cross Plains with deer and turkey. Ap- 

proximately 12 minerals. 
1450 acres near Albany with approximately $500 a month oil 

income, on pavement. $210 per acre. 

150 acres north of Eastland on pavement with 77 acres of 
cultivation and city water. $400 oer acre. 

1297 acres in Eastland County with some cultivation and im- 

prolasveda  grasses.cres, 
 n  acres

Good  place. 
peanut allotment, 5 miles West of Rising 

Star.  6o4   a  $c2r3e5s  pneear acre cr e 
Putnam, fair fences with three (3) stock tanks. 

$21  ireP
have 
r   

a cre.  ‘other listings large and small and all listings will be 
appreciated 

 

THE CROWN 
Mediwn firm, button tuft-
ed, ideal for children. One 
year guarantee. Mfg. Sug. 
Retail $59.00. Now $34.90. 
Western Mattress Co., 
1507 Austin Ave., Brown-
wood, Texas. Phone 643-
4141 in Rising Star. 4-tfc 

WANTED 	Twilite Acres 
Nursing Home is accepting 
applications for relief LVN, 
immediate position available. 
Phone 643 - 2681. 4 - tic 

FOR SALE - - 100 ft. 2" 
galvanized pipe. 65 ft. 2" black 
pipe. Ph. 259 - 2462. 7 -2tp 

WE CAN BUILT for you a new 3 
bedroom brick home with 
central heat and air. Low down 
payment. Monthly payments 
$65 if you qualify. For more 
information call H&W Develop-
ment Co., 629-1702, for Gary. 
48-tf 

FOR SALE--3 bedroom home. 
Living room, dining room and 
kitchen combination, bath, uti-
lity room, carport and storage 
room. Fully carpeted except 
kitchen and utility room. Ph. 
643-2452, Rising Star, 414 N. 
Main. 49-tic 

plo,cfreive  
frielidly% 

WANTED--Bermuda grass -
sprigging. Have new 4 row 
sprigger. Phone 643-3137, R.L. 
(Bob) Rust. 2-tfc 

I HEARING AID 
SALES AND SERVICE 

I tearing Aid. Sales and 
service and repair on all 
brands. John W. Clinton, 
Box 1206, Cisco, Texas. 
442- 2168. 

DOG GROOMING 
Ph. 915-646-1739 

Nancy Stanley 
1-6 mos. 

WANTED 
Large health care facility in 
Cisco area needs RN 
Director. Salary $90041000 
a month, depending on 
experience. 
Call 915-643-1863. t-19 

Political 

Announcements 

FOR SALE--2 bedroom home, 2 
acres land. Fruit trees, garden. 
Located I mile outside city 
limits. Ph. 643-2251. Jenkins 
Insurance Agency. 37-tfc 

NOTICE--Income tax returns 
prepared. annual and quarterly 
reports. bookkeeping and no-
tary public service. Phone 725-
6156, Mrs. W.R. (Pat) Erwin. 
2-tfc CARD 

OF THANKS 
POLITICAL CALENDAR 
The following persons have 

authorized this newspaper to 
announce their candidacy for 
political office: 

FOR SALE--Two bedroom -
home, one bath, kitchen-dining 
room combination, carport. lot 
well located in new addition. 
$12,000. Jenkins Insurance 
Agency. Phone 643-2251. 1-tfc 

NOTICE - - I offer complete 
income tax service. 

Nora Tischler 
May, Texas 

Phone 259 - 2191. 
4 - 4tp 

CARD OF THANKS 
We are indeed grateful to our 

neighbors, friends, and 
relatives for the cards, flowers 
and prayers at the passing of 
our loved one. 

May God bless each of you. 
The Family of 

Ottis Adams Jr. 

CONSTABLE PRECINCT 3 
E.M. ( Buddy) Turner 

N.D. Chancellor 
Hamp Kornegay 

COUNTY COMMISSIONER 
PRECINCT 3 

L.T. Owen - Re - ejection 

REAL ESTATE 
65 A. on Hwy, 36, new tank, 40 

pecans, $375.00 per A. White and Elna authorized 
sewing machine dealer. 
Repair all kinds, by factory 
trained mechanic. DAVIS 
FABRICS, 610 W. 2nd, 
Cisco. tfc 

JUST RECEIVED large 
shipment of 54" decorator -
upholstery fabrics. Herculon.5„. 
nylons, velvets, tapestries and 
vinyls. 

B- G PILLOW 
303 West Central 

Comanche, Texas 
Phone 915 - 356 - 5031. 

7 - 2tc 

55 A. more or less, pavement, 
8 peanuts, well fenced, some 
love grass, $375.00 per A. 

- - - 
74 A. extra nice land, part sub 

- irrigated, love grass, coastal, 
30 new land. 

STATE SENATOR 
Tom Creighton- - re - election 

CARD OF THANKS 
Words can't express our 

thanks for all the wonderful 
things that have been done for 
us at the passing f our loved 
one. Thanks to each one for the 
food, each beautiful flower, the 
cards, letters and the words of 
comfort. 

A special thanks to Dr. 
Carpenter for coming to our 
home, Higginbothams for the 
nice service, Lucille for 
arranging the beautiful 
flowers, our pastor, the Rev. 
Allen of Blanket and Johnny 
Lee for his comforting message 
from God's word. and Mrs. 
Clausen for her beautiful songs 
and Pat Walker for her sweet 
organ music. 

But above all to each of you 
for being such wonderful 
friends, neighbors and loved 
ones. 

May God bless and keep you. 
The Palmore Family 

SMALL HOME REPAIRS 
Reasonable rates for car-
pentry, patios, curbing, 
etc. No Job too small. 
442-1370 after 6 p.m. J.B. 
Reed. 2 mos. 

COUNTY SHERIFF 
Ronnie (R.B.) White 

John Morren 

Lou is 11 olly w pod 

Benny Moseley 

138 A. - - 1 peanuts, 35 
cultivation, good buy, only 
$235.00 A. 

listings Appreciated 
('OGBURN REALTY 
893 - WAG or 893 - 5898 

Deleon 

NOTICE - - Stanley Critters 5 
miles west 67 - 84 of Brown-
wood (follow signs). Now open 
Monday, Wednesday and 
Friday. to buy live caught 
Raccoon- - Fox- - Bobcat and 
others. Remember Flea 
Market every third Sunday 
monthly. 7 - 4tc 

STATE REPRESENTATIVE 
54th DISTRICT 

JOE C. HANNA Ire-election]. 

not pardon, we do If we do 
not love. 

It's a Fun Family Thing--
Read the Want Ads. 

4 - tfc Whatsoever you would laugh 
at in others, laugh at in 
yourself. FOR SALE - - 2 bedroom 

home, carpeted, built - in 
range and oven, 2 large lots, 
barn, greenhouse and fruit 
trees. $10,500. 846 Willis, 1 block 
from NURSING HOME. Phone 
817 - 643 - 4121 after 4:00 p.m. 
weekdays. All day on 
weekends. 4 - tic 

TAX ASSESSOR -
COLLECTOR 

Mrs. Nancy Trout CARPENTER, (build, 
remodel, and repair). Con-
sultation, estimates, financing, 
guaranteed, references. 24 hour 
service. Richard J. Cottrell, 
Box 143, May, Texas, phone 259 
- 2721. 5 - 4tc 

I re-election] 

STATE REPRESENTATIVE 
District 54 

Bob Vaught 

A Family Protection Policy STATE SENATOR 
22nd DISTRICT 
Tom Creighton 

FOR SALE - - Eleven full 
blood cornish game pullets and 
one rooster; two full blood 
Golden Sebrite pullets and one 
rooster. $1.00 each. Ph. 643 -
6526. 7 - ltc 

NOTICE - - Twilite Acre 
Nursing Home needs full time 
LVN for 3 - 11 shift. Ph. 643 -
2681. 7 • tfc J08 PRINTING CARD OF THANKS 

I acknowledge with deep 
gratitude the many expressions 
of love and concern extended to 
me during my recent hospital 
stay. 

The cards, visits, flowers and 
gifts were sincerely ap-
precia ted. 

May God bless each of you. 
Manon Cox 

g 2905 JULY'74 M.P. 31 

Safeguard Loved Ones 
In Case of An Accident 

Protecting your family and 
your financial security is 
possible at a cost of only 

pennies a day. Let us 
give you details! 

Call Today 

Jenkins t;:snakk  Insurance Agency 
P-0 ve.  Phone 817-643-2251 

Rising Star, Texas 

FOR SALE - - 80 A, 45 
cultivation, 10 peanuts. Pecans, 
young fruit trees, 2 tanks, small 
new home. 3 miles southeast 
Rising Star. $388 per acre. 
Phone 817 - 643 - 3949. 6 - 4tc 

LOST - - Female Irish Setter 
pup, 10 months old. South of 
town. Ph. 643 - 4337, Evelyn 
Donham. 7 - It For Big 

Events! 
A very special 
occasion needs 
a very special 
printer. Ask us. 

FOR SALE - - Extra clean 
Speed Queen Gas Dryer. Ph. 
643 - 7411. 6 - 21p 

FOR SALE - - 3 bedroom 
house to be moved, 205 East 
Ross, phone 643 - 6451. d - 3tp 

Your Local 
Newspaper 

FOR SALE - - Bermuda grass 
sprigs dug daily. Phone 643 - 
3137, R.L. (Bob) Rust. 2- tfc 

ETE.E. 

B & S Auto Parts 
• C B Radios & Accessories 
• Tape Decks 
• We Have A Complete Line Of 

Auto Parts And Accessories. 
• Lawn Mower Repair And 

Service 

John W. Bishop 
Owner - Manager 

SHUGART COUPON 
Thur. Feb. 19 

The Rising Star Office 
Main St. 

-••••••11•••••'-.  

Campbells 
country Store 

•••••••P-r-i-••••  

Prices Good Feb. 1 To Feb. 7 
Only While Supplies Last 

49` Pound Block Oleo--.35 
56c Lesieur Peas ---- .44 

Super Value, Bread, 24 oz. Loaf --.39 

5 lb. Pure Cane Sugar--.79 
$5.00 Purchase 

Phone 259-2323 May, Texas 76857 

9 
WALLET SIZE 

COLOR PORTRAITS WE HAVE OTHER LISTINGS 
LARGE AND SMALL 

ALL LISTINGS WILL BE APPRECIATED 

RODGER TERRELL 
Home Phone 629 - 2896 

M.L. TERRELL 
Home Phone 629 - 2443 
Eastland, Texas 

**nor,* 994 
* ASK • * 
Mail Extra charge 

X 101. 	fc r 
***(24,F4FE,:e.  GROUPS 

OFFICE PHONE 629 - 1725 
HIWAY 80 EAST 
EASTLAND, TEXAS 



-Eva Stroebel 

The Marriage of 
Miss Beulah Cox and 

Valdama Bleeker 

Relatives in Hamilton have re-
ceived announcement of the marriage 
Of Miss IIPOIliti COX, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. H. C. Cox, of Indian Oap. 
to Valdama ltimeker, of Caradan. 
The sacred vows were taken last 
Saturday afternoon. February 27. at 
5:00 o'clock. at the home of the 
Methodist pastor in Comanche. 

immediately following the cere-
mony the wedding party drove to 
the home of the bride's parents 
where an informal reception was 
heist and n bountiful wvdtlint: sup-
per served to a large assemblage of 
friends and reit:ON:es On Sunday ut 
noon a dinner was served in com-
pliment to Mr, and Mrs. meeker at 
the home of his parents. Mr. and 
Mrs. Silas Eleeker, at Caradan. And 
this occasion gave the friends of the 
groom in that section an opportuni-
ty to meet his lovely young bride. 
and there were many who joyously 
accepted invitations to the hospit-
able Sleeker home. After the din-' 
ner the happy young people went to 
their own home, prepared by Mr. 

Thursday, February 12, 1976 

sler 

Our Christian sympathy is 
extended to the family of Nina 
Grisham who lost a sister over 
the past weekend. 

We have no report as to the 
condition of Mrs. Bobeen who 
remains a patient in the V.A. 
Hospital in Temple. 

Our prayers continue to be 
lifted to Our Father on behalf of 
so many who are confined and 
are ill within our community. 
May our God bless each of you 
whatever your condition and 
status may be. 

Hubert Taylor 

Sofrial 
Dorcas Sunday Sunday School Class 

of the First Baptist Church held 
their monthly class meeting 
Thursday. 

The opening prayer was 
given by Mrs. Opal Dean and 
the devotional was brought by 
Mrs. Raymond Turner. 

We completed our yearbooks 
for the class. 

Delicious refreshments were 
served by the hostess of the 
month, Mrs. Madelle Jackson. 

Our next meeting will be held 
March 4, in the First Baptist 
Church. 

Reporter, Vera Ratcliffe 

First United 

Methodist Church 

In a recent newsletter from a 
friend he reminds us of 
something we already know 
about, but often ignore. Let me 
share these thoughts with each 
of you. 

Almost in every situation, 
when people are failing to be at 
their best and being the kind of 
church person God wants and 
needs us to be, it is the "little 
things" that seem to hinder us. 
It seems that we give way to so 
many "little things". We 
usually manage to stand strong 
in the face of real crisis in our 
lives. 	• 

On Long's Peak in the 
American Rockies there grew a 
huge tree which fell to earth 
not too long ago. Tree experts 
said it was a sapling when 
Columbus discovered America, 
and it was two hundred years 
old when the Pilgrim Fathers 
landed on the eastern coast. 
Lightning had struck it 14 times 
in vain, and it had survived 
hurricanes and avalanches for 
more than 400 years. But it fell 
at last when countless tiny 
beetles penetrated its trunk and 
reduced its great heart to dust. 

Let us be on guard for the 
"little things" that can destroy 
us. 

First Baptist 
Church 

Our church is having Revival 
Services this week. They will 
conclude thjs Thursday night. A 
youth banquet is set for Friday 
night. 

Are we in revival? 
Every church must face this 

question honestly. "Wilt thou 
not revive us again, that they 
people may rejoice in theee?", 
so prayed the Psalmist. So 
would we pray. 

The very word revival means 
different things to different 
people. To most it means a 

* week of preaching services 
with an evangelist. Others 
think of singing, shouting, 
tears, long prayer meetings, 

1.  and many other things. 
We will have to admit that 

many of these things might 
take place when revival comes. 

What is revival? Revival is 
not some emotional or worked 
- up excitement; it is rather an 
invasion from heaven which 

Nigiarings a conscious awareness 
f God. 
Someone has described 

revival as a person or com-
munity saturated with the 
presence of God. 

For each christian, as 
Stephen Olford expresses it, 
"Revival is ultimately Christ 
Himself, seen, felt, and heard 
in and through His body (the 
church) on earth." 

Charles Finney makes two 
pertinent statements: 

First that revival is nothing 
less than a new beginning of 
obedience to God. 

Secondly, that it was useless 
for christians to expect revival 
by simply asking for it without 
bothering to fulfill the laws 
which govern spiritual growth. 

It must be said, revival is 
God sent to prepared people. 

Sunday morning the pastor 
will continue the study of God's 
messages to the churches in the 
book of Revelation. This 
Sunday, "The Church at 
Philadelphia". 

Sunday evening the pastor 
will discuss what the Bible 
teaches about the blood of 
Christ and the forgiveness of 
sins. This will be the Bible's 
answer to an article appearing 
in the Abilene paper recently 
on the subject, "Receiving the 
Blood of Christ". Bring your 
Bible and study the truth of 
God's Word 

Visiting the morning service 
was Mrs. Kathleen Farris of 
Kokomo, Indiana. 
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Church of Christ 

What is a church? To most, a 
church is some kind of religious 
organization, often highly 
structured, and which generally 
holds meetings in a distinctively 
arranged and designed build-
ing. 
The word "church" has almost 
universally come to be restrict-
ed to the Christian community. 
The Jewish equivalent is 
"synagogue"; the Moslem 
term is "mosque"-at least as 
far as the place of assembly is 
concerned, and so on for other 
religious groups. The word is 
Greek in origin (ccclesia) and 
simply denoted an "assembly-
any assembly, called out for a 
specific purpose". In New 
Testament times, it described: a 
mob (Acts 19:41), a govern-
mesntal body in session (Acts 
19:39), the collective group of 
the Israeliltes in the wilderness 
(Acts 7:38). but in the over-
whelming majority of the 
instances where the term is 
used in the New Testament, it 
designates the body of disciples 
who were committed to the 
conviction that Jesus was the 
Son ofGod and the Savior of the 
world. It is thus employed more 
than one hundred times. This 
frequent use of the term is 
obviously intended to stress the 
importance of the idea portray-
ed. 

Properly understood, then, 
the church is not simply an 
organization, nor is it tied to any 
particular architectural theme; 
it is rather the collective 
number of those who have been 
called out of the world, by the 
Gospel (2 Thessalonians 2:14). 
to serve God, in and through 
Jesus Christ. 	It is thus 
apparent that, according to the 
New Testament, anyone who is 
a Christian is a part of the 
church, having answered the 
call of Jesus to "come follow" 
him. It is impossible, Script-
urally speaking, to separate the 
two. (More later) 

Build up your knowledge of 
God's Word by regular attend-
ance at our Bible classes: on 
Sunday at 9:30 a.m., on 
Wednesday at 7 p.m. and at our 
Assemblies on Sunday: at 10:30 
a.m. and 6 p.m. 
Those sick among us still 

include Elmo Mauldin. in the 
Stephenville Hospital, but 
showing a great deal of 
improvement. Mrs. Eva Oney 
remains in the Eastland Hospi-
tal (Room 216), after developing 
a bad cold and some congestion 
in the lungs. Minna Harding is 
now home and doing better. 
Gladys Carter is in the 
Brownwood Hospital (Room 
324), recovering from a broken 
leg. Patra Goss has been 
dismissed from the Brownwood 
Hospital and is now staying 
with relatives at 1102 Santa 
Clara in Brownwood, Alta 
Agnew has been sick again. 
Many others have been ill with 
flu, colds and other viral 
infections. 

Our young people enjoyed a 
period of fellowship, relaxation 
and snacks at the Weldon Hills, 
after services last Sunday 
evening. Plans are being laid 
for an area-wide meeting of 
young people here, for the 
second Sunday in March. All 
the children and teenagers of 
Rising Star arc invited to take 
part in our new and interesting 
program and activities for the 
youth. under the guidance of 
Jim Dickson and Robert and 
Karla Schulman. 
Have a good week. Call us if we 
can serve or help in any way. 
We would especially be thrilled 
at the opportunity to share with 
you the treasures ofGod's love 
and salvation. 

--Owen Aikin 

RECENT NEW SUBSCRIBERS 

INFANT'S 
STRETCH SETS 

Ladle's Fall And Winter 

DRESSES THERMAL UNDERWEAR 
SPECIAL 

Shirts & Drawers in a light 
weight fabric for extra 

warmth!--Reg. $3.69 EACH .  

Ladie's And Children's 

COATS & SWEATERS 
Also One Rack Ladies 

LADIE'S CO-ORDINATES 

1/2 

All Men's And Boy's Long Sleeve 
BASSETT BEDDING 

QUILT TOP MATTRESS 
SUPREME "312" 

'REGULAR 
SIZE 

QUEEN 
SIZE 

KING 
SIZE 

The Original 
Price S 

S 

S 

Ifrrirbr SET 

Riltr SET 

SCit  Fel S ET 31  -pc. BAKE'N SERVE SET 
INCOLORFUL 'GARDEN FLOWER' DESIGN! 

TREMENDOUS VALUE! WASH CLOTHS 4/$1 °° 
alece IMP 
*HAWS 011P 
SSC 

QTL 
i-ma. AU GRATIN DISH 

t10 99 —2/3 ALSO SERVES AS 
CASSEROLE (OVER 

KNEE-HI HOSE 

3/100  

DOUBLE KNITS 
COOK, SERVE 

IN THoeSpALAIOAEDDIpSuSIETE°Piti 
c• l silissirtiope ejlt • I PLASTIC LIDS FOR 
CASSEROLES 

OVAL CASSEROLE 

• • 

4:00u4RATISON:S; 

• "f:"1441" 	DOVER  

tisETEAituiTinurtincPsilis  

EXTRA 

ROUND  CAKE PAN 
9

•  .

1_EXTRA 

GRIM FOR 
(0C1(14';' 

IT RAri 
FUR SERVING,  

at. 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
18 FRIENDLY LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU 

THIS 1/4 /.•CE CONT11.1.1./Tite (1, 1.1 gs ✓ CIL SHIL9 

Nimrod News 
(EDITOR'S NOTE: The 

following is the announcement 
of the Cox- Meeker wedding as 
it was published 50 years ago.) FROM OUR CHURCHES 
Meeker in the little city of his na-
tivity, Caradan. 

The bride is a beautiful young girl 
and her personality embodies many 
lovable qualifies of womanhood. As 

the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. H. C. 
Com she enjoys the distinction of be-
longing to one of the longest time 
and most prominent families of that 
section of the country. She was horn 
and reared in the Indian Cap com-
munity. and was a high school stu-
dent ai the time of her marriage. 
She is loved and admired by a large 
circle at friends and was a favorite 
in all social affairs. Mr. Meeker 
is a ISO a descendent of (me of the 
leading families in that part of Or 
country. and is an expert mechanii• 
and hold:. a responsible and lucra-
tive plate with an automoLtie cma.-
cern in his little home city 

Mr. and Nfra. meeker are extend-
ed heartiest conkratulaiions by then 
hosts of friends and the sincere wish 
of all is that their future may be 
filled with happiness and blessed 
with prosperity. 

Mr. and Mrs. C.A. Livingston 
are here in the passing of his 
brother Jona who passed away 
in Stephenvilel Sunday. Burial 
was here held in Cisco. Others 
attending were a brother and 
wife of Midland, and a sister of 
Abilene. They all spent Sunday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. C.A. 
Livingston. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe D. Ziehr 

and little son, Kevin were 
Sunday luncheon guests of her 
parents, the G.C. Stroebels. 

Mrs. Drew Dan Jackson is 
home after major surgery in 
Hendrick Hospital in Abilene a 
few days ago, wish her a speedy 
recovery. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Wallace 

of San Angelo visited with 
sister the W.J. Rectors Sr., on 
Sunday. 

Mrs. Lillie Williams and Mrs. 
J.D. Otts were business visitors 
in Cisco Friday. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Cozart 

spent the weekend recently 

MR. AND MRS. V.M. BLEEKER - - will celebrate 
their Golden Anniversary on Saturday, February 21. 

Local Couple To Be Honored 
On 50th Anniversary 

with the Gene Parks family in 

Crowley. 

Those visiting the Herman 
Schaefers recently were Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Schaefer of 
Cisco, Mr. and Mrs. Dan 
Gleaner, Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Ingram, Mr. and Mrs. Rudolph 
Schaefer of Cisco. 

Dumas, Mr. and Mrs. Leo 
Bleeker and family of 
Levelland, Mrs. Patricia 
Martin and family of DeSoto, 
and Mrs. Amey Reams and 
family of Amarillo. 

Friends and relatives are 
cordially invited to attend the 
reception. 
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Mr. and Mrs. V.M. Bleeker 
will celebrate their 50th wed-
ding anniversary at their home, 
307 E. Pollock in Rising Star, on 
Saturday, February 21, from 
2:00 to 6:00 p.m. 

The reception will be hosted 
by their children Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Bleeker and family of 

Mr. and Mrs. Buford Cozart 
and Ham visited Mrs. Doss 
Cozart in Rising Star last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Truett Dawkins 
visited the Goldon Lawsons 
Sunday. 

Mrs. G.C. Stroebel has had a 
lot of visitors this week and 
enjoys them all. 

R.D. Williams 

FARM EQUIPMENT 

AUCTION 
SAT. - FEB. 14 	10:30 A.M. 

Rising Star City Park 
4 Blks. West of City on Hwy. 36 

Rising Star, Texas 
0 D. (Woodiel Chambers & Davy Jones are quitting farming & are offering 
their list of line form eqpt, for sole by Auction, along with a number of other 
area farmers who hove surplus eclat. Also additional consignments will b? 
accepted- 	 (Partial listing). 

TRACTORS 
5000 Ford Diesel wide front (excellent & extra clean) 
3020 John Deere Diesel wide front 
430 Case Triple Range Diesel wide front 

TRUCKS — TRAILERS — MISC. 
1973 Chev. 1 ton w/16 ft. Coachman self-contained overcab camper (extra nice) 
1972 Ford 1 ton Flatbed 4 SP - 490 V8 - Duals 
1973 Int. 3/4  ton Pickup 4 SP 	 Older Int. Peanut Truck 
2 — 4 wheel Peanut Trailers 	 1969 Choi. 4 dr. Impala 
Older Dodge Peanut Truck 	 1972 Suburu 2 dr. 
Welding Rig — 1965 Chev. 1 ton w/rebuilt motor — Lincoln pipeline 

welding machine, acetylene rig, welders bed, winch & goose neck hitch 
18 ft Deck Boot w/30 HP electric start motor & trailer 
1973 Yamaha 350 motorcycle 
125 Yamaha Motorcycle 

FARM EQPT. 
4 row Model RR4 J.D. 3 pt. Cultivator w/gauge wheels 3 fenders 
.ID double bar 9 shank spring Chisel 
Now Holland 9 ft. Swather w/crimper 
Now Holland 276 Hay Baler 
Now Holland 3 pt. side delivery rake 
Burch 4 row Planter w/fortilixer Boxes d extras fused 2 seasons) 
2 — Long 10 ft. 3 pt. Tandems w/scalloped ft. Disc 
A.C. 11 shank HD chisel Plow 
Fergenon 4 row Tilrvator w/row markers, bed shapers, hydraulics & lift assist 

wheels (near new) 
King 10 ft. 3 pt. Tandem w/scalloped ft. Disc 
KMC Kelley 2 row inverter Digger 
Lilliston 2 row Digger 
Long & Ronoak 2 row diggers 
Massey Fergerson 5 bottom Moldboard 
JD 4 row planter w/P71 planter units, row markers & box extentions 
Cole 4 row planter (2 yrs. old) 
Saddle mt. Spray Rig w/2 — 100 gal. tanks 
Bermuda King Sprig Digger 	 Long Peanut Combine (motor driven) 
Bermuda King 3 row Sprigger 	Int. 9 ft. 3 pt. Tandem 
1.1111ston Rolling Cultivator 	 PLUS many misc. farm related items. 

Additional Consignments WELCOME. 
An attendant wi I be on duty to accept your consignments Friday, Fob. 13 
n'iJ Day ci" S I,  

For information call 915-646-3956 after 6 P.M. 
AUCTIONEERS 

Dr. C.M. Cleveland-Cisco, Tx. 
Mrs. Lura Simpson--Orange, 
Haney Korrtegay—Odessa, Tx 
M.F. Webb--Brownwood, Tx. 
Cloyce McBride-•San Jose, Ca. 
Ray Darnell--Lowery AFB, Co. 
Mrs. W.D.Phillips-San Antonio 
Eva Watkins—Alamogordo,n.m. 
Mrs. Austin Smith--Odessa, Tx 
Bills Mac White--Hobbs, N.M. 
Eddy Petty--Cross Plains, Tx. 
Julia Wagley—Brownwood, Tx. 
Mrs. R.B. Chick--Rising Star 
L.W. Crawford—Rising Star. 

Wishing... 
doesn't make 

it so! 
Birth defects 
are forever. 
Unless 
you help. 

March of Dimes 

HENRY R. STOREY 

ASSOCIATES 
Brownwood, Texas 

TXGC — 76-0005 
1000/0 arrival of all listed merchandise is not guman1aed. NOTE 

•aateniaromananliimarow,allalenia asars....auknaasa.....aftna 
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or 
Faith has the answers; 
you need only ask for them- 

grq 

re you beset by problems so numerous that 

you cannot even decide the order of their 

importance? Then let faith in God guide 

your footsteps in the right direction 

toward the answer to your difficulties. 

Loneliness, insecurity, 

discordant human relations and other woes 

will all vanish as Divine guidance enables 

you to place everything in its proper 

perspective; and then you will begin to 

enjoy the true peace of mind as your burdens 

are lifted, one by one. God has helped 

solve the problems of mankind all through 

the ages. Trust Him with yours this Sunday. 

THE FOLLOWING MERCHANTS URGE YOU TO GO TO CHURCH 

LONG BRANCE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Sunday School 	 10 a.m. 
Sunday Service 	 11 a.m. 
Training Union 	 6 p.m. 
Preaching Service 	7 p.m.  

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rising Star, Texas 

Sunday School 	 9.45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11 a.m. 
Training Union 	 6 p.m. 
Ex ening Worship 	 7 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening Prayer Ser- 
vice   	7 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
May. Texas 

Eddie Martin, Pastor 

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
%Vest College Street 

Rising Star 
Sunday School 	 10 a.m. 
Preaching Service 	11 a.m.  
Sunday Evening Service 	6 p.m 
Wednesday Evening 	7 p.m.  

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
May, Texas 

Armo Bentley, Pastor 

Sunday School 	 10 a.m. 
Preaching Service 	11 a.m. 
Training Union 	5 	15 p.m. 
Evening Service 	 6 p.m. 
Prayer Meeting 	6.30 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Rising Star 
Owen Aikin, 

Minister 
SUNDAY: 
Bible Classes 	 9.30 a.m.  
Borning Assembly 	10:30 a.m. 
Evening Assembly 	6 p.m.  

WEDNESDAY: 
Devotional - Bible Study 	7 p.m. 

MOUNTAIN TOP 
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 

Sunday School 	 10 a.m. 
Sunday Services 	11 a.m. 
Midweek Services Each Thursday at 
7:30 p.m. 

UNIVERSAL FULL GOSPEL 
ASSEMBLY CHURCH 

Rising Star, Texas 
Vernon McGinn, Pastor 

Sunday School 	 10 a.m. 
Preaching Service 	11 a.m. 
Sunday Evening 	6 	30 p.m. 
Thursday Night 	 7 p.m. 

PENGECOSTAL CHURCH 
West Highway 36 
Mrs. A.J. Martin, 

Pastor 
Sunday School 	 10 a.m. 
Preaching 	 11 a.m. 
Preaching 	 7 	30 p.m. 
Children's Church and Bible School 

FIRST METHODIST 
Rising Star. Texas 

Hubert Taylor, Pastor 
A friendly church with a warm 

heart welcomes you to 
Sunday School 	 9.45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	 6 p.m. 
Choir practice Wednesday .7:30 p.m. 

CALVARY BAPTIST 
May, Texas 

Sunday Morning Service .10:45 a.m. 
Sunday Evening Service . . . 7 :30 p.m. 

METHODIST CHURCH 
May, Texas 

Family Night Each Wednesday 
Following Fourth Sunday 
Sunday School 	  

• 
10 a.m. 

Sunuay acnuur 	 to a.m. 
Preaching Service 	11 atm. 
Evening Service 	7 	30 p.m. 
Wed. Prayer Service 	7 p.m. Mach's Texaco John Yocham 

.o
Preaching Service 	11 a.m. 
MYF  	 7 p.m. 
(Mrs. Frank Madison, President) 
Prayer 	Service 	Wednesday 

Evening Following Second Sunday. 

Elite Cafe Somerford Gro. Jenkins Ins. Agency 
Rising Star 

Chamber Of Commerce 

Palace Drug Store Winfrey Medley Motor Co. Cecil 's Truck Stop Feed & Peanut Co. 

Wilson Exxon B & S Automotive Supply Butler Motor 
The Rising Star 

Agnew Gro. The Rising Star Clinic City Of Rising Star Buckley Ins. Agency 
... 

Robin's Beauty Shop Kountry Kitchen Pollock Service Station Twilite Acre Nursing Home 
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TARRA KAYLANE CLARKE 

— 
"Don't complain tout my equipment. if "Is' 
you didn't want to win so bad, you'd be 
playin' with someone else anyway." 

traiumnivanammumwast 
Twilite Acre News 

by ann mason 

imikva# VAIMALIVISMIM MI.  . ni z, 
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Kincaid's 
Real Estate Corner 

Ethel Degman visited Lena 
Mae Chambers at May. 

Melvin Boatman of Mona-
han's visited Hattie Boatman. 

Thelma Doboebner of Lake 
Brownwood, Bessie Barrows of 
Brownwood and Mrs. C. 0. 
Young of May visited with their 
mother Ora White. 

Mildred Jackson of Tuscon, 
Arizona visited Edna Barnes. 

HOUSES 
3 bedroom frame home, living room, dining room, kitchen, 

utility area with washer, dryer, bath, newly panelled throughout, 
single car garage and storage, corner lot, offered completely 
furnished, new Spanish style living room suite with hide - abed, 
color TV, dining room furniture, Spanish style bedroom suite, one 
brass bed and chest, one set twin beds, stove, refrigerator and 
other misc. items, all included at the price of $11,200.00. 

Large 3 bedroom frame, large living and dining room com-
bination, bath, garage, pecan trees, garden spot, large lot, 
located 115 Scurry St., Gorman. $10,500.00. Consider Terms. 

LAKE PROPERTY 

June Moore of Abilene 
visited Sallie Millwee. 
Buster Rixford is taking ad-
vantage of these warm days. 
He keeps busy at Lake 
Brownwood where he has built 
a cabin. Among his busy 
activities are fishing and boat-
ing 

We would like to welcome 
Wade Golson as a new resident 
at Twilite Acres. 

Russell Pointer of Baylor 
University of Waco visited Irene 
Vermillion. 

Bet-tie Medford spent the day 
with her son Bob Medford. 

Mrs. Ada Wright and Mrs. 
Jucille Furr of Eastland visited 
Maude Hill and Bet-tic Med-
ford. 

—• 
Mrs. Dick Harris of Otonnel 
and Mrs. Leonard Harris visited 
Irene Vermillion. 

Harvey Hamlett of Carlsbad 
New Mexico and J.T. Clark, Jr. 
and family of Wyoming. visited 
Dollie Clark. 

Mrs. Steve Williams and 
daughter Mary Louise of Clyde 
visited Lorraine Williams. 

LINDA CHRISTIAN 
Bride - Elect of Jackie Monsey 

Melvin Henson's Observe 
Mrs. Kenneth Boyd and son 

Mike and Mrs. Willie Hughes of 
Dublin visited Ethel Barnes. 

Local Couple Plan Wedding 
Silver Anniversary 

Saturday Club Hears 
Piano-Organ Recital 

Blanket; and Mrs. Karen 
Nelson, Abilene. 

Coffee and cake were served 
from the refreshment table 
which was centered with a 
three - tired wedding cake. 
Silver and crystal ap-
pointments were used in ser-
ving the family and guests who 
helped to make this a 
memorable occasion. 

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Henson 
were honored on Sunday, 
February 8, with a reception at 
their home on Route 2, Rising 
Star, in celebration of their 
silver wedding anniversary. 

The occasion was hosted by 
children of the couple: Mrs. 
Jolene Boatman, Lake Proc-
tor; Melvin Henson Jr., May; 
Mrs. 	Dorothy 	Blanton, 

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Christian 
of 114 Joyce Street, have an-
nounced the engagement of 
their daughter, Linda, to Jackie 
Monsey of Cross Plains. 

The couple will be married on 
March 5, in the sanctuary of the 
First Baptist Church in Rising 
Star, with the pastor, Reverend 
R.D. Williams, officiating.  

Miss Christian is a 1975 
graduate of Rising Star High 
School, and is presently em-
ployed at the Twilite Acre 
Nursing Home. 

The prospective groom, the 
son of Mrs. Evelyn Monsey of 
Cross Plains, is a graduate of 
Cross Plains High School. 

A program of sacred music 
was presented to members of 
the Saturday Club on Wed-
nesday afternoon, February 4, 
in the Methodist Church. 

The program consisted of 
piano and organ selections, 
played by Mrs. Carroll Rhodes 
of Cross Plains, and James 
Steel, a student of Hardin -
Simmons University. 

Please support MARCH OF DIMES 

Members and guests were 
extended a cordial welcome by 
Miss Elizabeth Robertson, 
elect president. Following the 
program, refreshments of 
coffee and cookies were served 
in the club library. Mrs. Lela 
Clark, Mrs. H.E. White and 
Mrs. E.L. Ratcliffe were 
hostesses for the occasion. mot 

mare  
ers 
on birth defects 

Knit N' Stitch 
Gift Shop 

Needlepoint, Crewel Embroidery 

Knitting & Crochet Yarns & Needles 
Crocheted Afgans 

Luzier Cosmetics 

Open 10:00 A.M. - 5:30 P.M. 
Monday - Saturday 

Mrs. Susan Rhodes-Owner 
465 W. Cypress 	Cross Plains, Texas 

I.C.A. Coils For Cut 
In Beef Imports 

taTnizialleag.. 
Visitors in the home of Mrs. 

Robbie Henderson recently 
were her granddaughter and 
husband, Jerry and Cindy 
McGhee of Crawley, Texas. 

Mrs. Margie Earp, Mr. and 
Mrs. Herman Claborn, Mr. and 
Mrs. Mutt Carroll, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Hill, Mr. and Mrs. 
C.A. Claborn and J.C. Claborn 
attended the funeral services 
for Ottis Adams in Odessa last 
Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Clarke of 
Fort Worth are proudly an-
nouncing the birth of their 
daughter, Tarra Kay Lane, who 
was born Saturday, February 
7, 1976, at All Saints Hospital. 
She weighed 7 lbs., and 13 ozs. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Zirkle of 
Rising Star. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. William Clarke of 
Rising Star. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Clarke 
have a three year old boy, 
Quentin, at home. 

-I(* * * * * * * ** * * * * * * ** * * * * * 

"sat back and waited on 
voluntary restraints which did 
not work and State Department 
agreements which did not 
materialize." 

"I say it's time to take the 
State Department out of family 
farming and ranching," the 
I.C.A. president said. 
Cunningham noted that Japan 

and the European Community--
the world's two other great beef 
importing markets--"have had 
the good sense to save their 
domestic beef producers by 
cutting imports." 

RISING STAR 
CEMETERY ASSOCIATION 
This week we are grateful to 

the following for their con-
tributions toward the care of 
our cemetery: 

PERMANENT FUND 
Mr. and Mrs. I.L. Edwards, 

Midland - - $100 
Mr. and Mrs. L.F. Foster, 

Brownwood - - $10 
Mrs. Katy Jones, Kingsville, 

Memorial to Mr. and Mrs. A.N. 
Snearly and Mark and Zona 
Clark - • $20 

MAINTENANCE 
Minnie Reynolds - - $2 
Interest on Certificate of 

Thur. Feb. 19 

AUST1N•-The head of the 
state's largest livestock organi-
zation says foreign beef imports 
will continue breaking the back 
of the Texas cattle industry as 
long as President Ford refuses 
to use remedies available to 
him. 
T.A. Cunningham of Gonad, 

president of the Independent 
Cattlemen's Association of 
Texas, called on the President 
and Agriculture Secretary Earl 
Butz "to cut imports or explain 
why they let the beef industry 

4 go broke:" 
The 1000.000-member Cattle-

men's Ass'n, largest group of 
its kind in both Texas and the 
nation, was organized in 2974 
when it became evident that 
American agriculture was be-
coming a pawn in U.S. foreign 
policy. 

Cunningham pointed out that 
a 1964 meat import law gives 
the President authority to 
reduce imports at any time 
without waiting for the law's 
import quotas to go into effect 
automatically when imports 
reach a maximum allowable of 
1.1 billion pounds a year. 
Cunningham said that imports 
continued to increase last year 
while the President and But/ $75.15 Deposit 

161/2  acres Possum Kingdom, 2200 ft. frontage, 6 lodges: Main 
lodge 2775 sq. ft. (2) 1352 sq. ft., (3) 1944 sq. ft. (4) 1640 sq. ft (5) 
1144 sq. ft., (6) 1066 sq. ft. Recreation bldg. 3600 sq. ft. All com-
pletely furnished, own water system, butane system, sewer 
system, boat dock boat launching ramp, all in good repair. For 
Sale or Trade. 

24 acres of land Lake Leon, over 1400 ft. water frontage, road 
frontage on 3 sides, needs a developer. $24000.00. 

100 acres, 3 4  mile water frontage with 30 acres irrigated from 
wells. 1 4 mile highway frontage, pecans, deer and quail hunting, 
excellent building site. $350.00 per acre. 

260 acres approx. 11/2  miles water front, good house, out 
buildings, 34  mile highway frontage, pecans, 35 ac. cult. an ex-
cellent buy at $325.00 per acre. 

SMALL TRACTS OF LAND 
:02 acres highway frontage, trees, good building site, $2000.00. 
12 acres all coastal, 4 irrigation wells, outskirts of Anson. Also 

has hog sheds and farrowing set up, completely fenced and cross 
fenced with hog wire, will G.I. $12000.00. 

25 acres, creek bottom land, highway frontage, good tank 
$10000.00. 

631 /2  acres of land, secluded and rough, good grass, improved 
varieties sown, no minerals, good tank, excellent deer and bird 
hunting 3 1  mile off pavement, 6 miles from town. $300.00 per acre. 
Terms available, would consider G.I. plus cash. 

Two 4I acre tracts that adjoin, tank water on both, highway 
frontage, not far out, good open grass land with scattered trees, 
city water possible. $16000.00 each tract. G.I. 

101 acres good improved native pasture, close in, some trees, 
some creek bottom, net fences, 2 good tanks, good deer and bird 
hunting. City water possible. $375.00 per acre. Terms. 

70 acres coastal, good net wire fences, 2 pastures, well, tank, 
barns, close in. $400.00 per acre. City water possible. 

40 acres coastal, close in, good fences, $400 per acre. Will take 
G.I. plus cash. City water possible. 

36 acres brush land, close in, city water, excellent location, 
$14,000.00. Will G.I. 

107 acres, good fences, barns, south of Carbon, 2 tanks, one 
well, 85 percent minerals, $350.00 per acre 

135 acres tn.w. rising Star, several good water wells, some 
orchard, good peanut allotment, asking $350.00 per acre, make us 
an offer. On pavement. Financing available. 

FARMS AND RANCHES 
237 acres, excellent grass land, scattered clumps of live oaks, 

good highway frontage and excellent location, 2 tanks, city will er 
possible, $350.00 per acre, good terms can be arranged. 

320 acres, highway frontage, 60 ac. cultivation, novv_ki  
bluestem, creek, well, 4 tanks, good net wire fencelleXcellent 
terms can be arranged. $325.00 per acre. 	 . 	i• • 

840 acres improved ranch, nice house, barns, corrals, several 
pastures and traps, 3 wells, 8 tanks, 2 springs, good location, on 
pavement, good bird and deer hunting, fish in tanks, good net 
fences. $350.00 per acre. Excellent terms. 

1000 acres good grass land, 2 wells, 8 tanks, good net fences, no 
bldgs., pavement, good location, $300.00 per acre. Excellent 
terms. 

650 acres rolling, semi open grass land, some bottom and river 
frontage, good fishing in river, pecans, several good tanks, 1 
water well, 40 ac. coastal, 25 acres grain, excellent deer hunting. 
air strip, net wire fences, 2 houses, 35 miles from city limits Fort 
Worth $350.00 per acre, excellent terms. 16 percent down balance 
to be arranged 81/2  percent interest. 

1068 acres highly improved ranch located on Paluxy River, 
welded pipe corrals, landing strip and hangar, good barns, ex-
ceptionally nice 3500 sq. ft. home, 3 other houses, 80 acres coastal, 
45 acres grain, excellent fishing, deer and bird hunting. 50 miles 

,from downtown Fort Worth. $600.00 per acre. Excellent terms. 15 
percent down, balance to be arranged 8 percent interest. KING SIZE 

WAllE1 
CREATIVE 

COLOR 
PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY 

- - - 
Jim Palmore and family of 

Kansas City, Kansas; Mrs. 
Lynda Cochran and family of 
Beaumont; Carroll Palmore 
and family of Hobbs, N.M., and 
Mrs. Nancy Reneau and family 
of Denton were here to attend 
funeral services for their 
father, W.P. Palmore last 
Wednesday. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. William 

Wakefield of Las Vegas, 
Nevada, spent the weekend in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
James Anderson. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Butler 

were Sunday visitors of Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenny Butler and Jamie 
in Abilene. 

We have for sale or trade large ranches, irrigated farms, all 
sizes anywhere in the Southwest. Also motels, office buildings, 
shopping centers, commercial property of all types. Contact us 
for whatever you need. 

ROBERT M. KINCAID REAL ESTATE 
100 South Sea man 	 Eastland, Texas 

629 - 1781 
Robert NI. Kincaid Night Phone 629- 2815 

FIRE 
Russell Poynor and Miss 

Gloria Cline, students at Baylor 
University, were weekend 
visitors in the home of his 
mother, Mrs. Mildred Childers. 

1111.11=11.1 401111MMIll 
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Be a winner! Open a checking account with 

FIRST STATE BANK 
Our modern facilities will produce a clear bank statement 

each month so you know exactly where your money is 

being spent, plus having cancelled checks for receipts. 

FIRST STATE 
BANK 

Mrs. Helen Donham and 
visitors. Mrs. Katie Farris and 
son, Micky of Indiana spent 
several days in San Antonio last 
week. Micky flew home from 
San Antonio and Mrs. Farris 
returned home with Helen to 
spend a few more days here. 

- - - 
Charles Haynes of San 

Angelo, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Haynes of Katy. Texas: Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Haynes Sr., of 
Eastland: Mr. and Mrs. H.E. 
West of Brownwood; and 
Darwin 	Dickerson 	of 
Comanche visited Mr. and Mrs. 
W H. Dickerson last weekend. 

Gil PIMA'S MIDI Of GRANDPA, 
GRANDMA, DID, MOM OD All WI 

OME DIM Al NM SINE LOW PEW 

Mr. and Mrs. Cotton Looney 
of Trickham visited Mrs. 
Ludene Michael on Sunday 
afternoon. 

Member F.D.I.C. 

Rising Star, Texas 

Suppose It Went 
Up in Flames . . . 

Could your farm rise from its 

own ashes and start where it left 

off? That presupposes adequate 

insurance coverage ... enough to 

replace everything. 

Because of rising costs, your 

policy may need reassessment. 

Mrs. Jim Christian and Miss 
Manon Cox have returned 
home from Eastland Memorial 
Hospital. 	Manon 	is 
recuperating in the home of 
Mrs. Georgia Miller. 

Call fur :appointment 

Mr. Elmore Mauldin, father 
of Oleta Seale, is in Stephen-
ville Hospital recovering from 
serious illness and should be 
home soon. 

R.L. Buckley 
Insurance Agency 
Rising Star --- Phone 643-4421 

PARKING • DRIVE-IN BANKING 

EXCELLENCE IN BANKING 



LEGAL NOTICE 
NO. 7984 

Wildcat Tales 
•••I • Sponsor 	 Mrs. Linda Bu 

\ 	Editor 	 Peggy Petit 
g Assit. Editor 	 Susan Walke 

Sr. Reporter - eady For Everything. 	Susan Walker 
Jr. Reporter - Today, Not Tomorrow- 	Tricia Jones 
Soph. Reporter - In Search of the Future......Jenny Walker 
Freshman Reporter - In the Fishbowl  	Kim Harris 
FFA Reporter -With the Farmhands 	Doddie Chambers 
FHA 	Reporter -Toward New Horizons ....Randie Bradley 
Annual Staff Reporter- A Yearbook Never Forgets . Pam Hill 
Cheerleader Reporter -All the Way Big Blue...Kathy Wilson 
Boys Sports -Wildcat Country 	  .Ken Hounsel 
Girls Sports -LC's Goldfingers 	 KCD Rutherford 
Band Reporter -Do Re Mi 	  . Nancy Medford 
Library Reporter -With the Bookworms 	Beth Wallace 

eporter - at - large -Galloping Gossip 	Clark Smi 

The Council will sponsor each 
project. 
We hope that the Student 

Council will help the school 
spirit, pride, and the student 
boyd most of all. Each one of us 
will work hard for this and any 
suggestions will be appreciated. 

Darla Hosch 

Sipe Springs 

News 

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Weston of 
Carbon visited Mr. and Mrs. 
John McKeehan. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dave Miller of 
Carlsbad, N.M., are visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. Guy Houser. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
McKeehan visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas Johnston in Coman-
che. 

Audrey Whiteside of 
Comanche visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Whiteside. 

Mr. and Mrs. G.T. Whittle 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Carson 
Seals and Mr. and Mrs. Stanley 
Hejhl and girls in San Angelo. 

Visitors in the Dick Wyatt 
home have been Mrs. Dorothy 
Robinson of Comanche, Mr. 
Kenneth Foster and son, Bill of 
Austin, Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Bibles of Cisco and Hollis 
Burton of Comanche. 

Mr. and Mrs. Covie Weaver 
and family of Dallas visited Mr. 
and Mrs. T.A. Weaver. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Jones, 
Travis and Susie visited the 
Jack Millwee family. 

Moe Rainer had surgery in 
Temple last week. Mrs. Moe 
Rainer, Mr. and Mrs.. George 
Leonard and Mr. and Mrs. T.A. 
Weaver have been down to visit 
him and say he is doing well. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Skippy Morgan 

and children of Odessa visited 
Mr. and Mrs. N.L. Leonard. 

Thelma Price has gone to Los 
Angeles, California, to visit her 
mother, Mrs. John Humphrie. 

Mr. and Mrs. Travis Boswell 
of Arlington visited Ruby 
Boswell. 

- - - 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Anderson 

and girls visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Herman Anderson and Zelma 
Margan. 

Mr. and Mrs. McCaskell and 
Eula Parker of Austin visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Washburn. 

SIPE SPRINGS 1918 - - The King and Leonard Garage. Left to right: Kirksey, 
shop foreman; Charlie Leonard, Keefer Anderson, M.J. Duke and Terry Hattaway. 

'V T Y .w //r if 1r 

May News 
Entha Campbell. 

.#A Jl _a- fi—a_ 

The Ada Prentice Unit of the 
May United Methodist Women 
met on Monday the 9th at 2:30 
p.m. in the home of Mrs. Buck 
Helton. Mrs. Lloyd Alexander, 
president. was in charge of the 
program of a continued study of 
Exodus. Chapter 1-6, entitled a 
new leader. 

Mrs. Kelton led the group in 
singing the opening song 
"What a friend we have in 
Jesus" with Grace Glenn at the 
piano. The Lords Prayer was 
led by Mrs. Charlie Branum. as 
it was repeated in unison. 

The group honored Mrs. 
Jackie Palmore with a pink and 
blue shower. Refreshments 
were served to 15 members and 
guests. The next meeting date 
for the group will be Feb. 16 at 
2:30 p.m. in Friendship all with 
Mrs. Frank madison and Mrs. • 
Alta Alexander leading theBible 
Study. 

Visitors in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Mabra over the 
weekend were Mr. R.L. and 
Frances Blissett of Ft. Worth, 
and Mrs. Margaret Mabra and 
her daughter. Gladys Howell 
and her son of Comanche. 

Mrs. Grace Glenn spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Todd and Mr. and Mrs. Liston 
Todd and girls at the Todd 
Ranch in Albany. mrs. Opal 
Fleming and Mrs. Grace Glenn 
visited the Eastern Star Chapter 
in Sipe Springs Tuesday night. 

Seventeen people attended the 
May Community Improvement 
Club Feb. 9 at 7:30 p.m. They 
had an old fashioned box supper 
which netted the club over *,  
5223.00. The money will be 
used for Club House (MCIC).  
improvements. 

BIRTH DEFECTS 
ARE FOREVER. 

untos YOU 
HELP. 
MARCH 

OF 
DIMES 

Thursday, February 12, 1976 
S.MENtICALNT 

ESTATE OF EVERETT  

EDWARD PARKER, JR., 
DECEASED 

tF in illetifiniiiitiAl 
IN THE COUNTY COURT OF * 

EASTLAND COUNTY, TEXAS 

NOTICE TO ALL PERSONS * 
HAVING CLAIMS AGAINST • 
THE ESTATE OF EVERETT 
EDWARD PARKER, JR., 
DECEASED 

Notice is hereby given that 
original Letters Testamentary 
upon the Estate of Everett 
Edward Parker Jr., Deceased, 
were issued to us, C.L. Parker 
and Ira L. Edwards, as In-
dependent Executors, on the 
22nd day of January, A.D. 1976, 
in the proceeding indicated 
above, which is still pending, 
and that we now hold such 
Letters. All persons having 
claims against said Estate, 
which is being administered, in 
the County above named, are 
hereby required to present the 
same to us respectively, at the 
addresses below given, before 
suit upon same are barred by 
the general statutes of 
limitation, before such estate is 
closed, and within the time 
prescribed by law. Our 
residences and post office 
addresses are as follows, to -
wit: C.L. Parker, 213 Fanning, 
Hurst, Texas, 76053, a resident 
of Tarrant County, State of 
Texas; and Ira L. Edwards, 
3102 Douglas, Midland, Texas, 
79701, a resident of Midland 
County, State of Texas. 

Dated this 4th day of 
February, A.D. 1976. 

Emory C. Walton 
Attorney at Law 

Post Office Box 527 
Eastland, Texas 76446 

Attorney for C.L. Parker 
and Ira L. Edwards, 

Independent Executors, 
Estate of Everett Edward 

Parker Jr., Deceased. 
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Carbon, which ended our 
chance for district. But all in all 
the season was a success. The 
overall record stands at 18-9. 
Next year we'll get 'em!! 

Track season officially began 
Wednesday. This year we have 
a lot of people interested in 
tennis and it looks like we will 
have a good team. A few are 
talking about playing golf but I 
think we'll have to wait and see 
about that. Volleyball had 
district play last, September but 
a few will be working out in 
preparation for next year. 

Til next year, 
KC 

Pioneer News 
-Mrs. A.C. Halsell 

	s. 

THE PRODIGAL RETURNS! 

Boy, is it good to be back! I 
got so bored in that hospital that 
I would go to the waiting room 
and watch people get in and out 
of the elevator. I did get pretty 
good at playing Solitare, but 
that didn't work since every 
time l's get started some nurse 
would come in to check my 
vitals. I only got really worried 
one time when, after checking 
my vitals, one of them just stood 
watching me closely for a 
minute, then picked up the 
equipment and left. IT TOOK 
ME A LITTLE WHILE BEFORE 
I realized he had been counting 
my breaths. 
The only thing I regret about 

having that surgery is the awful 
itching where they stitched me 
up. Hopefully that will soon go 
away. otherwise I'm going to 
mess up this sewing job. 

As usual. whereever I go. I 
am inevitably followed. I hope 
Gwen has as much fun as I did. 
Bobby has my deepest sympa-
thies. They would have to cart 
my straight to the mental ward 
if I had to spend two solid weeks 
in bed, and that's no joke. 

Still sanely (??) 
Mahal 

Earl Nichols of Dallas was 
visiting Wade Chambers and 
other friends in our community 
last weekend. 

very complimentary of the work 
the club is doing. 
Mr. and Mrs. Cleo Barton 

visited Mr. and Mrs. Sessums 
Sunday. 

Mr. D.I. Sessums of Ft. 
Worth who has ranch holdings 
in the Longbranch community, 
visited Mr. and Mrs. W.T. 
Sessums last week-end. 
Mr. and Mrs. W.T. Sessums 

made a business trip to 
Brownwood last Wednesday. 
They attended the cattle auction 
while there. 

DO RE MI 
U.I.L. contest is here! Jenny 

Walker, Jeanne Hounsel, Shaon 
McGinnis, Pam Hill. Susan 
Walker. and Marilyn Clark 
represented our band. Best 
wishes to them from all of us! 
We are busy working on the 
music for the U.I.L. contest in 
March. We arc also polishing 
up our sight-reading skills. 
Some of the music we arc using 
will be in our spring concert. 

I hope everyone is decided on 
a career, thanks to that career 
education program. The 
Seniors should be getting their 
jackets soon. 

Must go! 
Nancy 

STUDENT COUNCIL 
GETTING IT TOGETHER!! 
The Student Council is now 

active in the school. The 
representatives were elected 
last week. Senior reps are 
Denise Willett and Mark 
Griffin. Darla Hosch and Bruce 
Williams represent the Juniors, 
Kaycee Rutherford and Nicki 
Newbury were lected by the 
Sophomores. and Sharon Mc 
Ginnis and Mark Wilson were 
chosen by the Freshinen. The 
Student Council President was 
chosen by the whole student 
body. We saw fit to give Toni 
Hill that responsibility and 
honor, with Clark Smith as his 
vice-president. 
At our first meeting, Jan. 30, 

1976. the Student Council 
elected their officers and 
chairmen of the appointed 
committees. The officers arc as 
follows: Secretary--Denise 
Willett: Treasurer--Mark 
Griffin:Reporter—Darla Hosch. 
The chairmen are: Work and 
Projects-.Clark Smith: Devo-
tional—Bruce Williams; Wel-
coming Committee--Kaycee 
Rutherford: Publicity—Darla 
Hosch: and Recreational Com-
mittee--Denise Willett.. Our 
sponsor is Bobby Fortune. 
'Me Student Council will meet 

every Thursday on the first 
N‘eck of every month. We hope 
that each month there will be a 
protect offered by e telt erade 

If you feel that Will Rogers 
was not joking when he said, 
"All I know is what I read in the 
newspapers." you may recon-
sider when you read F.B. 
Sanborn's quote, "The careful 
reader of a few good news-
papers can learn more in a year 
than most scholars do in their 
great libraries," 

Dr. T.R. Havins, retired 
professor from Howard Payne 
University. died in San Angelo 
on Feb.6. 

Wade Chambers is improving 
since his illness several weeks 
ago. 

Mr. R.T. Copeland seems to 
be improving satisfactorily 
since having his right foot 
amputated on Feb. 4th. He is in 
a hospital in Abilene. 

Mr. Homer C. Altum died in 
the Stephenville hospital Feb. 7 
at 8 a.m. He was buried here in 
the May Cemetery last Monday. 

Visiting in the home of Sam 
Altum has been, Mrs. Alma 
Poland of Oak Ridge, Tenn.; 
Mrs. Jessie Newcomb. Hous-
ton; Mr. & Mrs. Dwain Kelly, 
Mrs. Richard Froh, Mr. & Mrs. 
Raymond Altum, Abilene; Mr. 
Burl Newcomb, Mr. & Mrs. 
Dale Newcomb and two children 
of Houston; and Mr. Paul 
Newcomb and Craig of Fuquay. 
North Carolina. 

Norris attended a singing in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Burl 
McCowen in Cross Plains 
Saturday night. A large crowd 
attended and the musical 
program was enjoyed by all who 
attended. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Norris 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Calvin 
Roady one day last week. 
Mrs. Ruby McCowen, Naomi 

and Bobby Jack had lunch with 
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Norris 
Sunday. 

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Leonard Norris during the week 
were Mrs. 011ie Montgomery, 
Mrs. Thelma Pevey, Mrs. Ruby 
McCowen, Naomi, Bobby Jack 
and Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Simons all of Cross Plains, Mrs. 
Hiram Foster, Mrs. Winnie 
Flippin and Mrs. Vera Montfort 
all of Pioneer; and Mr. and Mrs. 
Rodney McCarty of Coleman. 

TODAY, NOT TOMORROW 
Mrs. Violet Odor ofFt. Worth 

and Mrs. Evelyn Kemp of Ft. 
Smith, Arkansas, visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. W.T. 
Sessums during the week. They 
visited the Pioneer Quilting 
Club on Tuesday. They were 

This week finds the Juniors 
getting ready to take our second 
quarter tests. _Good Luck, 
everyone! 
Last week we chose our 

student council representatives, 
Darla Hosch and Bruce Will-
iams: We were late in getting 
the council started. We hope to 
have an active student council 
for the remainder of the year. 
One member of our class has 
decided to take a vacation. 
Gwen Winfrey was in the 
hospital with appendicitis. Isn't 
it strange how some people 
always choose to get sick right 
beton.. quarter exams? We miss 
Gwen and hope she gets hack in 
time to get in on the fun of 
taking exams. 

See you, 
Tricia 

IN THE FISH BOWL 
Dear Rising Star Wildcat 

fans. We arc sorry to inform you 
that you %%ill have to spend 
some time lahorously. The 
electricity is out and with 
sumnwr coming on we will need 
you to act as the cooling system 
for RSIIS because we wouldn't 
want the brilliant minds wand-
ering ;wound in this building to 
sulti.r Iron; heatstroke. 

Those visiting in Mr. and 
Mrs. Ben Atwood's home 
during the week were Mr. and 
Mrs. Hiram Foster, Mr. Wanda 
King and Blandie, Mrs. Ethel 
Anderson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Odom of Cross Plains. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Walker 
had supper with Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer Don Parson, Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Don 
Parsons had Sunday lunch with 
Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Hutton, 
Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Walker 
and son Bradley had Sunday 
lunch with Mr. and Mrs. Cowan 
Hutton and family. 

Mr,. and Mrs. Don Sooter and 
two children spent Saturday 
night with Mrs. W.B. Sooter. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dutch Shults, 
Mrs. Opal Dean and Mrs. Cleo 
White of Rising Star visited 
Mrs. Ethel Brown, Sunday. 
Mrs. Edna Sanders of Abilene 
and Mrs. Lou Grider and Mrs. 
Velma Brown of Pioneer visited 
Mrs. Ethel Brown on Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Wilcox 
and little Jimmy Charles spent 
Saturday and Sunday with her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
A.C. Halsell. 

Those visiting in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Fore, 
Sunday. were Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Blackburn of Cisco; Mrs. 
Estelle Huntington of Brown-
wood; and Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Huntington and daughter, Mary 
of Brady. 

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Fore made 
a trip to Cisco Saturday. 

Mrs. Grace Eakin Norris and 
her husband Mr. Leonard 

Bye. 
Kim 
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LC's GOLDFINGERS 
RSHS 	season ended a 

little differently than expected. 
Last Monday the Cats lost to 
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