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Staff Photo by Janie Hartman 

Craig Felderhoff was valedictorian and Deborah Hale was 
salutatorian of the graduating class at Muenster High. 

Farm Bureau qualifies 
for voter registration 

Staff Photo by Janie Hartman 

Gus Reiter and Susan Walterscheid are salutatorian and valedictorian 
of Sacred Heart's 1984 graduating class. 
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40 graduate from Muenster schools 
Much Is being said these days 

about the urgency of improving 
the state's school system. The 
soecial meetings promoted by 
Ross Perot suggest a number of 
changes scrapping standards of 
past years and replacing them with 
new ideas. 

A suggestion is to give the 
children more class time by a 
longer class day and eliminating 
some extra curricular activity such 
as too frequent sports events, and 
also to lengthen the school year 

Of course, few proposals come 
without price tags, and Governor 
White now calls for a special 
legislative session to raise the 
billions that will be needed to fund 
the new ideas. All of which makes 
sense if kept within common sense 
guidelines. For instance, few will 
deny that teachers deserve a pay 
raise, and merit teachers deserve 
an inducement. But is it necessary 
to give extravagant pay and add it 
to current expenses? 

In keeping with suggested im-
provements, some present frills 
could be taken from the 
curriculum at substantial savings 
while giving the kids more basic 
subjects. And the astronomical 
waste of busing for integration 
could be eliminated to save 
billions. And why not?...when 
opposed by whites and blacks 
alike! The original purpose was to 
allow all students to attend the 
school of their choice. But busing 
doesn't achieve that. It doesn't 
allow freedom of choice, just 
forces students to go where in-
tegrationists dictate. Freedom and 
economy could both be served by 
this means. We're all for raising 
tax to increase school revenue 
wherever it's needed. However, 
we firmly believe the governor and 
the legislature ought to be as 
determined to save as to generate 
new revenue. 

In applying the principle, 
education reform urgently needs 
to tackle the nation's program; 
even more so than the state's. 
School's everywhere could be im-
proved vastly by cutting out 
radical ideas, radical programs 
and degrading courses orginating 
with organizations like the Depar-
tment of Education and the 
National Education Association. 
For years those people have been 
sabotaging American schools, 
destroying traditional values like 
morality, patriotism, free enter-
prise and respect for God and 
fellowman as observed by our 
forefathers. 

Just a few of the country's ed-
ucational faults were brought to 
light a few days ago in an article in 
Human Events after a number of 
hearings on education requested 
by Secretary of Education Terrell 
Bell. In it Phyllis Schlafly wonders 
whether the secretary will publish 
the essence of more than a 
thousand pages of testimony by 
American parents on what their 
children are being taught. The 
testimony is significant though 
belated because it reveals the very 
facts that Bell asked for in 1974. 
Well, he's been told what parents 
think and the question now is can 
he or will he buck the forces of evil 
which are undermining American 
education? 

Schlafly said the extensive 
report speaks with the thunderous 
voice of hundreds of parents who 
are angry at how their children 
have been mentally and 
emotionally abused by experimen-
tal and behavioral programs 
during classroom hours when the 
parents thought their children 
were being taught basic education. 
Parents complained that such 
programs are alienating school 
children from their parents, from 
religious beliefs, and from our 
nation's patriotic heritage. Paren-
ts claim that educator "change 
agents" have spent federal tax 
dollars to use local schools as 
laboratories for social engineering 
and experimentation rather than 
for traditional academic instruc-
tion. 

From this we have an idea of 
what America really gets from 
many programs hailed by the feds 
as their aid to education. 

	

A 	Pennsylvania 	parent 
testifying at a Washington hearing 
said she removed her four children 
from school after discovering that 
sexually explicit films were used in 
a human development curriculum 
required for all students. She said 
a 20 minute film for eighth graders 
was morally degrading. Actually 
pornography was used in teaching 
young children. 
Please see Confetti, page 2 

Muenster 
High School 
"Make the most of your 

education, be the best in what you 
do." That was the message of Ur-
ban Endres to the seniors of 
Muenster High School at their 
graduation Friday night. 

In keeping with that aim he 
suggested giving careful thought 
to the immediate future, whether 
to continue their studies in college 
or technical school to qualify for 
future comfort and happiness. 

He reminded them too that their 
heritage of freedom permits them 
to do whatever they wish, and the 
sky's the limit. The Wrights were 
the first to fly, Lindberg was first 
across the ocean, astronauts were 
first to the moon, and now in-
dividuals talk about going there. 
He also mentioned the marvels of 
computers and communications as 
a reminder that opportunity is 
unlimited. 

The Cooke County Farm 
Bureau board of directors has ap-
proved a voter registration cam-
paign to help make a maximum 
number of persons eligible to vote 
in the Nov. 6 general election, ac-
cording to Leonard Hartman, 
county president. 

In order to facilitate 	the 
registration of eligible voters, the 
county Farm Bureau has received 
approval for a deputy voter 
registrar to be stationed in the 
county office at Gainesville, 
Highway 82. The registrar is 
Norma Leslie, county secretary, a 
staff member of the Farm Bureau. 

County President Hartman said 
his organization urges farmers and 
ranchers and others in the county 
who have not done so to come by 
the county office to register. 

Students of Sacred Heart High 
School were honored for their past 
year's achievements at the 
school's annual recognition and 
awards banquet last Thursday in 
the parish community center. 

Their program also included a 
valedictory message by Susan 
Walterscheid and a salutatory by 
Gus Reiter. 

Tim Voth was the master of 

US 	Congressmen 	Charles 
Stenholm and Ralph Hall will join 
Kent Hance this weekend cam-
paigning with Kent Hance in 
behalf of his nomination as 
Democratic candidate for US 
Senator in the general election. 

The trio of representatives will 
start early Saturday the 26th 
traveling to most of the major 
cities in Stenholm's and Hall's 
districts. "I want to encourage 
people of my district to put their 
full support in the US Senate can-
didate who will truly work in our 
best interest," Stenholm said. 
"Kent Hance is undoubtedly that 
candidate." 

Starting at Texarkana the Han- 

Keep in mind, he said, that 
there are three kinds of people: 
those who make things happen, 
those who watch things happen, 
those who don't know what hap-
pens. A parting thought was "Go, 
get 'em." 

Diplomas 	to 	the 	twenty 
graduates were awarded by D.J. 
Hellman, president of the school 
board, with Eddie Green, prin-
cipal, assisting. The class spon-
sors, Mr. and Mrs. Jon Ward, did 
the honors of changing class rings 
and tassels. 

In addition, three scholarships 
were awarded by Principal Green. 
As valedictorian, Craig Felderhoff 
received one from Independent 
Colleges and Universities of the 
state, and one from state supported 
institutions. Debbie Hale, as 
salutatorian, received one from 
the independent institutions. 

Also, certificates of perfect at-
tendance were awarded to Pam 
Hermes, Paula Russell, Wesley 
Sicking, Steven Vogel and Duane 
Walterscheid. 

Eligible voters may also register 
at the county courthouse, Har-
tman said. Deadline for 
registering this year is October 7, 
30 days prior to the general elec-
tion. 

Hartman said one of the main 
purposes of Farm Bureau is to 
represent agricultural producers in 
government. 

"In this urban society, rural 
people need to register and vote 
for their voice to be heard in 
public affairs," he said. 

Hartman noted that the Farm 
Bureau is the largest organization 
in Texas with some 313,568 mem-
ber families in the state. 

"Rural people not only have a 
stake in good government, but 
also the voting power to do 
something about it," he said. 

ceremonies, Father Denis Soerries 
opened the event with an in-
vocation and ended it with a 
prayer. And the awards and in-
troductions were made by Sister 
Cabrini, principal in the studies 
and by Coaches John Bartush, 
Virgil Henscheid, Julian Walter-
scheid and Jon LeBrasseur in the 
sports. 

In academics three nominees 

ce statewide tour will move west-
ward cutting across Texas and en-
ding in Stenholm's West Texas 
district. 

Congressmen Hance, Stenholm 
and Hall plan press stops and 
campaign receptions in Greenville, 
Sherman, Denison, Gainesville, 
San Angelo and Abilene, all in a 
single day. 

"It will be a day well spent," 
Ralph Hall said. We're expecting 
a good showing of supporters in 
each town. We're there to remind 
them to get out and vote for Kent 
on June 2." 

Two congressmen will go their 
separate ways Saturday while 
Hance continues traveling until 
the day before June 2. 

Sacred Heart 
High School 

Fr. Denis Soerries advised seniors 
of Sacred Heart High at their 
graduation Sunday evening that 
the way to success, comfort and 
happiness in this life and the next is 
to stay close to Christ, that His 
way is the sure way to avoid many 
mistakes which appeal tem-
porarily but lead to disappoin-
tments. 

In that regard he referred to 
challenges like drink and drugs, 
shirking religious and scholastic 
duties or deserting the solid prin-
ciples of their early training. 

He further stated that it's wise 
to be prepared for hard work in 
college. Whereas high school is in-
clined to "help you pass, the 
colleges seem to dare you." And 
the next important thought is the 
proper idea of success. The real 
measure of success is not to be rich 
or famous, but to be helpful to others 
and live up to Christian principles. 

He specially urged a more 
responsible attitude to marriage 
than our present society has. 
Though divorce is accepted by the 
world it is failure, usually causing 
unhappiness and broken lives. 

Father Denis likewise told 

As the 1984 harvest approaches, 
the outlook is highly satisfactory. 
That is the general impression as 
seen and heard by Muenster's two 
grain dealers as well as County 
Agent Craig Rosenbaum and 
ASCS Supervisor Tim Gilbert. 

The first good news is that the 
crop is a dandy and probably rates 
as a near equal to the 1983 average 
of 42 to 45 bushels per acre. A 
conservative guess is 35, and the 
actual figure yield hopefully will 
improve later when combines get 
on the job. 

- %,: -"ett A. (Andy) Stelzer, state 
conunander of the Veterans of 
Foreign Wars, will participate in 
Muenster's annual memorial ser-
vice to be held next Sunday, May 
27, following the 7 a.m. Mass at 
Sacred Heart Church. 

The service, to be conducted by 
VFW Post and Auxiliary, will 
start with a procession from the 
church to the cemetery led by the 
post's color bearers and honor 
guard along with Auxiliary of-
ficers carrying wreaths, flower 
bearers, and the public. 

First stop in the cemetery will be 
the crucifixion statues where the 
Auxiliary will place a wreath 
honoring all deceased persons of 

were listed for the top honor in 
each subject, after which a winner 
was named. In listing them here 
the winner is listed in capital let-
ters for each subject and others 
are listed in lower case. They are: 
Please see Awards, page 3 

Crash is fatal to 
Linda Otto Lusk, 27 

Funeral service for Linda Otto 
Lusk, 27, of Austin was held at St. 
Mary's Church, Gainesville, at 10 
a.m. Saturday with Father 
Nicholas Fuhrmann as celebrant 
at a Mass of Christian Burial and 
George J. Carroll and Son direc-
ting interment in Fairview 
Cemetery. 

Pallbearers were Tim Bolinger, 
Joe Hundt, Bill Arendt, Gary 
Beyer, Danny Hoenig and Don 
Vogel. Before the funeral rosary 
was recited at 7 p.m. Friday in the 
funeral home chapel. 

Mrs. Lusk died Wednesday 
from injuries received in a traffic 
accident in Austin. 

Among survivors are her 
husband, John Lusk of Austin; 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Clif-
ford Otto; her sister, Sue Otto; her 
brother, Mike Otto, all of 
Gainesville, and her grandparents, 
Mrs. Joe Vogel of Muenster and 
Mr. and Mrs. W.W. Otto of 
Gainesville.  

students to be grateful to parents 
and parish for the sacrifices made 
in giving them a good start and to 
live up to the principles they are 
taking from Sacred Heart. 

The graduation followed the 6 
p.m. Sunday Mass at Sacred 
Heart Church with liturgy 
specially arranged for the oc-
casion. Participants were Jim Bar-
tush, Jeannene Voth and Rita Pels 
in scriptural readings; Sondra 
Trubenbach reciting petitions; 

More good news is the price. 
The latest quotation, from Tony's 
Seed and Feed, is $3.70 to $3.80 
for hard wheat, as compared with 
$3.50 last year. 

On the other hand the bad 
news, at least up to now is limited. 
Scotland reports indicate a disease 
in the grain, probably identifiable 
as crown rot. It has been observed 
in only a few patches and is expec-
ted to cause little trouble unless it 
spreads rapidly and soon. Over all 
the crop is in good health. 

As of now farmers are sweating 

EMMETT A. (ANDY) STELZER 

the parish and prayers will be 
recited. 

Next stop is the service men's 
area where Auxiliary members will 
place floral arrangements at the 
monument and children will place 
individual red carnations on the 
service men's graves. That will be 
followed by prayers for the 
honored dead, a memorial 
message, and the traditional taps 
by Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Weinzap-
fel and a three-volley rifle salute 
by the VFW honor guard. 

Special places of honor and 
special flowers are provided by the 
Auxiliary for Gold Star parents. 
Mrs. Frank Bayer and Mrs. 

Gail McGraw, Jon LeBrasseur 
and Judy Carver presenting offer-
tory gifts, the class in an offertory 
song, Serena Wright leading the 
songs and reciting a graduation 
poem. Fathers Denis and Victor 
were con-celebrants. 

Diplomas were presented after 
Mass by Father Denis with Father 
Victor and Sister Carmelita 
assisting. Serena Wright, class 
sponsor, turned tassels as the 
grads received diplomas. 

out the starting date, which is ex-
pected to be early next week. 
Moderate weather with this week's 
rain apparently has caused a few 
days of delay. 

Acreage this year is greater 
because less has been taken out of 
production to participate in 
federal programs. County wide 
some 4,000 acres are idled whereas 
the figure was near 11,000 last 
year. 

The report on oats is less 
favorable. It is rated as only fair 
and the acreage is limited. 

Theresa Moster will receive cor-
sages, Frank Bayer and J.M. 
Weinzapfel will receive bouton-
nieres. 

Commander Andy Stelzer is a 
native of Muenster, born June 26, 
1926, now living in Post and in 
business as an independent oil 
operator. He and his wife 
Rosemary have three children, 
David, Linda and Mary Ann. 

He served in the Rhineland and 
Central Europe 21 months during 
World War II, receiving the 
EAME campaign ribbon with two 
bronze stars, the Army of Oc-
cupation ribbon, World War ll 
victory ribbon, and two overseas 
bars. 

He is a 35 year VFW member 
and has held all offices at the post 
level including two years as com-
mander, also a year as district 
commander and a year at depar-
tment instructor, a year each as 
junior and senior state vice-
commander before being electd to 
his present office of state com-
mander. 

Triathlon winner 
Harry Scoggins extended his 

athletic career through another 
major athletic event last Sunday at 
the Texoma Triathlon in Sher-
man. He was first place winner in 
the 50-59 age group with a time of 
I hour, 36 minutes. Activity of the 
triathlon includes a 300 yard 
swim, a 16.5 mile bike ride and a 
5K (3.1 m) run. 

Stenholm and Hall join 
Nance on campaign trail 

Awards banquet honors SH students 

Harvest outlook is encouraging 

State Commander Andy Stelzer to have 
part 'n Sunday memorial service 

Good News 
Acts 4: 32-35 

The community of believers were of one heart 
and one mind. None of them ever claimed 
anything as his own; rather, everything was held in 
common. With power the apostles bore witness to 
the resurrection of the Lord Jesus, and great 
respect was paid to them all; nor was there anyone 
needy among them, for all who owned property or 
houses sold them and donated the proceeds. They 
used to lay them at the feet of the apostles to be 
distributeu to everyone accoraing to nis need. 



COMMENT 

Outsmarting 
The Bear. 

When the bear's loose on Wall Street, thc-,, with large 
investments there, have cause to worry. The bear is 
mean. But he can be outsmarted. Just join the Pay-
roll Savings Plan and buy U.S. Savings Bonds each 
payday 

The variable interest rate lets you share in higher re-
turns of a bull market Then, if the bear does appear, he 
won't be able to chew up your entire nest 
egg. You're protected by 	 0'1) s `l?,  
a guaranteed minimum. T

ake The smartest move you 
can make is the move to 
U.S. Savings Bonds. 	StoC1KNGs sO 

tnAmerica. 
mind  
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Confetti 
continued from page 1 

The testimony goes on and on, 
teaching disrespect for religion 
and patriotism and our economic 
systems, and denying a difference 
in right and wrong. 

We don't have to depend on 
such hearings for an idea of many 
twisted theories as well as outright 
crimes that are being imposed on 
American Young people by 
criminals and/or demented 
phonies. The daily news exposes 
them frequently. We need no 
more evidence that education 
needs a thorough housecleaning. 
This should be priority in the state 
and the nation. After that, im-
provements can be built on a 
sound foundation. But to pour 
more money on present depravity 
is only a way to perpetuate the evil 
and probably Increase it. 

L AST WEEK we looked at an 
excerpt from a sermon by 
evangelistic T.D. Hall telling 

us why we should praise the Lord. 
Today we look at another excerpt 
from this same sermon on how we 
can praise the Lord. 

Singing is one of the greatest 
ways a Christian has to praise the 
Lord. "My heart is fixed, 0 God, 
my heart is fixed: I will sing and 

give praise. I will praise thee, 0 
Lord, among the people: I will 
sing unto thee among the 
nations" (Psalm 57:7,9). If we 

love Jesus there should never be a 
time when a song leader says, 
"Let's sing" that a Christian does 
not wholeheartily respond. I 

guarantee you that it pleases God 
for you to praise Him in this way. 
It glorifies Him for you to sing. 
You are praising God when you 
sing. 

Prayer is another way we have 
of praising God. "Because thy 
loving-kindness is better than life, 

my lips shall praise thee. And my 
mouth shall praise thee with joyful 
lips: When I remember thee upon 

my bed, and meditate on thee in 
the night watches" (Psalm 63:3, 
5b - 6). This can be done 
anywhere. You can pray like the 
psalmist in your bed. You can 
pray while you drive down the 
highway. You can do it while you 

I N A 1982 Gallup poll it was 
found that 95 percent of the 
American people believe there 

is a God, "the God of Abraham, 
Isaac and Jacob." Another 
Gallup poll, conducted in late 
1983, found that 81 percent of our 
people are in favor of the Prayer 
Amendment. Only 14 percent op-
posed it, while 15 percent had no 
opinion. 

Why is the Prayer Amendment 
necessary? Why is there such a 
sense of urgency about this 
project? We think Congressman 
Newt Gingrich of Georgia, 
speaking on the floor of the House 
on March I of this year, summed 
up the reasons pretty well when he 
said: 

"...I came to realize that here in 
the United States there really is a 
sense of concern about religious 
freedom and a sense of 

frustration, and year by year we 
have seen the American Civil 
Liberties Union and its lawsuits 
erode what were basic American 
beliefs for the first 180 years of 
our history. I came to realize that 
there is no answer except a con-
titutional amendment." 

Here is what the Prayer Amen-
dment says: "Nothing in this con-
stitution shall be construed to 

prohibit individual or group 
prayer in public schools or other 
public institutions. No person 
shall be required by the United 

wash dishes. You can even go into 
the closet to pray. But there is 
plenty of time in every day to 
praise the Lord. What better way 

could we ever use our lips to praise 
the Lord as we pray to Him ex-
pressing our gratitude. We can use 
our lips to share our testimony 

with the saved and the lost. 
Wherever you go you can praise 
God and share with people what 
the Lord means to you. When this 

is done, some people will be ready 
to listen and trust the Lord. 

According to Psalm 63:4 
another legitimate way of praising 
God is by lifting our hands to 
Him. In some churches this is 
practiced and in others it is not. 
But all Christians should realize 
that it is a scriptual way of 
praising God and not criticize 

those who do. It will be a great 
day in Christendom when 
Christians stop being suspicious of 
others just because they praise 
God in a different way. Especially 
when it was practiced by the 
psalmist. 

One lady told about how God 
helped her to overcome this 
problem. She had not been used to 
attending church where people 
would lift their hands to the Lord 
during prayer or during the songs. 
She seemed to recoil when this 
would happen, but could find 
nothing in the scripture that would 

States or by any state to par-
ticipate in prayer. Neither the 
United States nor any state shall 
compose the words of any prayer 

to be said in public schools." 

	

Rabbi 	Seymour 	Siegel, 
professor at the Jewish 
Theological Seminary of America 
in New York, in supporting the 
Prayer Amendment, writes: 

"...an education interfused with 
reverence for the Divine will help 
lead human beings to deal kindly 
with each other...ln prayer, we 

acknowledge our dependence on a 
Power greater than our own... 
Man may master all of science, 

literature and history, but if he 
does not know how to establish a 
dialogue with God, if he has not 
learned how to revere life and 
life's Creator — he has not fully 
developed his humanity..." 

We agree with D.L. Cuddy, 
Ph.D., of Raleigh, North 
Carolina, who has pointed out the 
"freedom of speech" aspect of 
banning prayer. In a letter to 

Human Events, he wrote: "The 
Issue is whether we lose our right 
to 'freedom of speech' when we 
set foot on public property." 

There is an attempt right now in 
Congress to limit permissible 
prayer to "silent prayer and 
meditation." Says Cuddy, "But 
'freedom of speech' is meaningless  

forbid Christians praising God in 
this fashion. She asked the Lord 
to give her understanding about 
this matter. One day when she was 
in the kitchen she heard her two 
year old child crying in the den. 

She went in to check on her child 
and when she walked in the room, 
her little one lifted both hands 
straight up toward her. And all at 

once the Lord spoke to her about 
her problem with the raising of 
hands during the service. When 
she saw her child lifting her hands 

she knew that she wanted her and 
that she needed her and everything 
in her was ready to reach down 
and pick her child up and meet her 
needs. And the Lord said to her, 
"That's the way I feel when I see 
my children lifting their hands." 
She went on to give her testimony 

that after this experience she 
found that when others did it, it 
did not bother her. And, in fact, 
she found herself practicing this in 
private and in some occasions in 
the church along with others. 

Clapping hands is another way 
of praise. "0 clap your hands, all 
ye people, shout unto God with 
the voice of triumph" (Psalm 
47:1). In some churches people 

clap their hands during some of 
the songs and after special music 
if they have received a special 
blessing. In other churches people 

would be very much offended by 
this. However, they do praise God 
in other ways. The Christian at-
titude should allow for Christians 

to use whatever methods which 
best suit them to praise the Lord. 
One way is not necessarily more 
spiritual than the other because he 

is praising God in a certain way. 
However, every Christian should 
be praising God in some way. 

unless it means 'audible' speech. 
Therefore, if students in public 
schools can voluntarily say 
audibly, 'Thank you, teacher: 

can we deny them the freedom of 

speech to voluntarily say audibly, 
'Thank you, God?' " 

As this is written the Prayer 
Amendment is being debated in 
the Senate. It would appear that 

the liberal humanists in that 
chamber will be able to prevent 
the amendment resolution being 

passed in its proper, undiminished 
form. The liberal humanists in the 
House have the amendment 

resolution bottled up in committee 
and are so numerous as probably 
to be able to keep it there. 

The only remedy for the people, 
the only way we will ever be able 

to put God back in public life and 
institutions, is by going to the 
Senate 	legislatures 	with 

resolutions calling for a conven- 
tion to amend the constitution, 
just as has been done with the 

balanced budget amendment. 

The People want God back in 
American life! The humanist- 

dominated courts and Congress 
have denied Him. It is now time 

for the People to act through their 
States! 

O N A typical evening a few 
years from now, the boys in 
the Kremlin may get 

together after a hard day's work 
to share vodka and swap funny 
stories about the Americans who 
humiliated themselves over the 
1984 Olympics. Remember Jesse 
Jackson rushing to meet with 
Anatoliy Dobrynin, the Soviet 
ambassador to the U.S.? Remem-
ber Walter Mondale advising 
President Reagan to "roll up his 
sleeves" to get the Soviets to 
reverse their decision? Ho ho ho, 
comrade. 

Despite wishful thinking by 
various politicians and Olympic of-
ficials, it is unlikely that the 
decision to boycott the Olympics 
will be reversed. It was a cold, 
calculated decision, necessary to 
avoid the spectacle of Soviet-bloc 
athletes deserting the "socialist 
paradise" of their youth. Who 
knows how many runners would 
have crossed the finish line and 
kept running to the nearest im-
migration office? 

As usual, commentators in this 
country are falling over each other  

in the rush to blame the boycott 
on the United States. It's in 

retaliation for our boycott of the 
Moscow Olympics four years ago, 
they say. It's because of Ronald 
Reagan's anti-communist 

rhetoric, they say. The President 
should make concessions to get 
Soviets to change their minds, 
they say. 

One wonders whether the same 
commentators would wring their 
hands if South Korea, Chile, and 
other anti-communist nations 
boycotted the games. Would they 
encourage the President to crawl 

on his knees and beg them to show 
up for the torch-lighting 
ceremony? Or would they say the 
games are better off without those 

countries? 
South Africa is banned from the 

games, and the Republic of China 
on Taiwan is allowed to par-
ticipate only on the condition that 
it not use its own flag and national 
anthem. Politics has always been an 
integral part of the competition, 
as the Soviets have long under- 

stood. 
In 1958, Pravda declared: "An 

important factor in our foreign 
policy is the international relations 
of our sportsmen. A successful 
trip by the sportsmen of the 
USSR, of the (communist) coun-
tries, is an excellent vehicle of 
propaganda in the capitalist coun-
tries." As Time magazine put it 
recently. "The Soviets...view suc-
cess on the Olympic stage as vin-
dication of the Soviet system..." 

Then why the boycott? First, 
the U.S. made it clear that it 
would make things difficult for 
the spies the Soviets were sending 
by the boatload and planeload in-
to this country. For example, the 
U.S. denied a visa to the Soviet 
"advance man" for the Olympics 
— the man responsible for 
preparations for the Soviet 
athletes — because he was a well-
known KGB agent. 

The Soviets were upset over the 
decision to accredit Radio Free 
Europe and Radio Liberty to 
cover the games, and they strongly 
objected to the financing of the 
games by "capitalist" companies 
like McDonald's and 7-11. 
(Because much of the Olympic ac-
tivitiy is being financed by private 
enterprise, the 1984 games may be 
the first since 1932 to make a 
profit.) 

And, by boycotting the Olym-
pics, the Soviets can send the 
message that they just can't get 
along with Ronald Reagan. With 
an eye on the November election, 
they can make it look like the 
President is an impediment to 
peace. (Incidentally, they tried to 
same sort of tactic in West Ger-
many last year and failed 
miserably.) 

But perhaps the most important 
reason was the fear of defections. 
Members of the Ban the Soviets 
Coalition, an organization of 165 
anti-communist groups, planned 
to set up "safe houses" where 
defectors could hide from the 
KGB. They were going to adver-
tise the sanctuaries through han-
dbills, posters, and radio announ-
cements. They planned to rent 
billboards that would display (in 
Russian) telephone numbers for 
defectors to call to get help. In ad-
dition, they intended to spread 
the word in Los Angeles through a 
network of people speaking dif-
ferent Soviet-bloc languages. The 
dissident network inside the Soviet 
bloc was to help spread the word 
behind the Iron Curtain. 

The Soviets do not understand 
why the U.S. government cannot 
simply round up the Coalition 
members and keep them out of 
sight during the games. After all, 
that's the way the Soviets handled 
the Moscow Olympics in 1980. 

They exiled some 300,000 "un-
desirables" from the city, in-
cluding dissidents. They denied 
some two million people their 
normal access to the areas where 
the games were held. They used 
slave labor to build Olympic 
facilities and to mass-produce the 
cute little teddy bear that was the 
games' mascot. Meat, produce, 
canned foods, and other scarce 
items were taken away from 
people in the rest of the country 
and sent to Moscow, so that the 
abject poverty of the Russian 
people would not be apparent to 
visitors from around the world. 

Unfortunately for the Soviets, 
this is a free country. We don't do 
that sort of thing in America. 

For decades, the Soviets have 
dragged young children away 
from their parents, pumped them 
full of hormones, and tried to 
create a sort of "master race" of 
athletes. Like the Nazis, the 
Soviets have used every oppor-
tunity to politicize the Olympics 
and turn ceremonies into 
propaganda shows. If they are so 
afraid of their own athletes that 
they would rather lose by default 
than compete. I say good riddan-
ce 

Richard Viguerie 

Let' em stay home 

 

Dr. George S. Benson Looking Ahead 

 

The Prayer Amendment 

  

The 
An 
inc 

or II 

is• 

p. 

cal 

Ilt****************** 11 
Open Memorial Day - 10 a.m. to 2 p.m. 	4(  

CEILING FANS 

T
y  

41(  

41 	 --", 
■•,..'..-- 	 -.."-', 	• 

4( 
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4( 	Your Choice 	• 3 Speed Pull Chain Control 

Or 	

• Reversible For Summer 

* 	
52" 4 Blade 

Cool or Winter Warmth 4   
-ir 	42" 5 Blade 	• Extremely Oulet Operation 

or 52" Ceiling • 5 Year Limited Warranty 

41( 	Hugger 	• 5 L Tested and Listed 

4Ir 

41( 	Manufacturer's Suggested Price .0. 
88 

0 0 
Polished or Antique Brass Ilk 

$199 95 
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.11( 	WE DISCOUNT PRICE...NOT QUALITY 

. tRODNEY'S HOMEFINISHINGS 
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33.20 
30.10 
36.10  
37.27  
43.79 

A.78-13 	26.31 
E-71-14  
0.7514 
F•75.15  
0.79-15 
1.79.15  

Set Front or rear wheel 
caster, camber, and toe on 
cars with adjustable sus-
pension. Chevettes, light 
trucks, and cars requiring 
MacPherson Strut correction 
extra. 

sal 995  
Everyday low price 

Prices good through June 2, 1984 

GOODYEAR 

These Goodyear tires are tops in value! 
And the low sale prices make it easy to 
find the tire buy that's right for your U.S. 
or imported car or light track. 

Steel Belted All Season Radial 

Arriva Radial 

• Save gas with steel belted radial 
ply construction 

• Dependable wet-dry traction 

• Use with front or rear wheel drive 

SIZE AND 
SIDEWALL 

P155501113 

P15610R13 

P19675R14 

P20575R14 

P20575R15 

P21575R15 

P22575R15 

P235759115 

PRICE WITH 
OLD TIRE 

4171 

59/4 

07.45 

75.41 

7019 

7117 

7134 

5112 

I BE si1=R211," 

STEEL BELTED RADIAL 
Custom Polysteel Radial 

• The tire that keeps its Het 
even in the rain 
• Steel AND polyester 

YSTEEL gives you POW 
NOTE. Rib count and sigewall 
styling vary with size, not 
all tires look exactly like the 
tee shown 

PRICE WITH 
OLD TIRE 

42.45 
54.06 
61.33 
64.55 
67.17 
60.46 

P20575R15 

SIZE AND 
SIDEWALL 
P15680R13 
P111580R13 
P19675R14 

P21575R15 
P22575R15  

DISC BRAKE SERVICE 
New front disc pads, repack 
front wheel bearings, resur-
face front rotors Convention-
al rear-wheel drive vehicles. 

Prices vary for front wheel 
drive. Hydraulic Service will 
be recommended if need for 
safe vehicle operation. 

WHEEL BALANCING 
!) $ 500 

per wheel 

Corrects shakes and 
shimmy, improves tire life 
and wear. Balanced elect-
ronically and weights install-
ed as needed. 

Everyday low price 

We have road hazard warranty 

optional at $500  per tire. 

This includes FREE flat repair 

for the life of the tire. 

Credit card convenience for automotive needs. 
Sign up now at your nearby Goodyear retailer 
• Use The Silver Card nationwide at participating 
Goodyear retail outlets • Enjoy credit convenience 
whenever you travel . GoOD ,,,oyEAR  

Goodyear Tires And Auto Service 
For More Good Years In Your Car 

PRICES, LIMITED WARRANTIES AND CREDIT TERMS SHOWN ARE AVAILABLE AT GOODYEAR AUTO SERVICE CENTERS SEE ANY OF THE BELOW LISTED 
INDEPENDENT DEALERS FOR THEIR COMPETITIVE PRICES. WARRANTIES AND CREDIT TERMS. AUTO SERVICES NOT AVAILABLE AT STARRED LOCATIONS 

CBJ, Inc. 
Charlie Haverkamp, Owner/Manager 

Gregg Otto, Assistant Manager 

710 Summit, Gainesville, 665.6020, 665.3722 

Now accepting 

VISA' 

POPULAR BIAS PLY WHEEL ALIGNMENT 
Power Streak II 

SIZE AND 
SIDEWALL 

• The strength and 
resilience of 
polyester cord body 

• Plenty of road 
contact for all-
around traction 

PRICE WITH 
OLD TIRE 

Home Economics: 
ROSE FELDERHOFF 
Le Ann Mollenkopf, Christy Yosten 
English II: 
LYDIA WALTERSCHEID 
Paula Yosten, Laura Flusche 
Biology: LAURA FLUSCHE 
Lydia Walterscheid, Ken Hesse 
Spanish II: PAULA YOSTEN 
Neil Hesse, Lydia Walterscheid 
English IV: 
SUSAN WALTERSCHEID 
Gus Reiter, Anne Felderhoff 
Civics: JEANNENE VOTH 
Mark Hesse, Susan Walterscheid 

FOM I: TRACY HENSCHEID 
Algebra II: 
KYLE WALTERSCHEID 
Stephen Schmitt, Rose Felderhoff 
Geometry: 
LLOYD WALTERSCHEID 
Ken Hesse, Lydia Walterscheid 
World Geography IO: KEN HESSE 
John Nasche, Susan Walterscheid 
Accounting: 
SUSAN WALTERSCHEID 
Religion III: ROSE FELDERHOFF 
Sandy Taylor, Christy Yosten 

NOT SHOWN: 	  

English III: SONDRA HESS 
Le Ann Mollenkopf, 
Rose Felderhoff 
Arts & Crafts: LEROY VOTH 
Jeannene Voth, Troy Yosten 

Presidential Academic Fitness 
Awards: Anne Felderhoff, Nick 
Hess, Susan Walterscheid, Mark 
Hesse, Jeannene Voth, Gus 
Reiter. 

Balfour award: Susan Walter-
scheid. 

Balfour runner-up: Jeannene 
Voth. 

Valedictorian award: Susan 
Walterscheid. 

Salutatorian award: Gus Reiter. 
Leadership awards: Neil Hesse 

and Jeannene Voth, student coun-
cil co-presidents. 

Mary Josephine Cox scholar-
ship to CCC: Susan Walterscheid 
and Gus Reiter. 

Beta Kappa scholarship, presen-
ted by Loretta Felderhoff: Gus 
Reiter. 

Scholarships of state colleges 
and universities: Susan Walter-
scheid. 

Scholarship of independent 
colleges and universities: Susan 
Walterscheid and Gus Reiter. 

Athletics 
In recognizing athletic honors 

the coaches reviewed the season 
record of each team along with the 
team rosters and the individual 
record of each member on local, 
district and state levels. Heading 
the long list were senior lettermen 
participating in football, boys and 
girls basketball and boys and girls 
track. A number of boys won all 
district, all area and all state 
qualifier honors in three sports. 
Also several girls received similar 
honors in two sports. The senior 
lettermen were Jim Bartush, Ron 
Dangelmayr, Anne Felderhoff, 
Marilynn Hartman, Duane 
Haverkamp, Mark Hesse, Neil 
Hesse, Nick Hess, Carmen 
Sicking, Susan Walterscheid and 
Troy Yosten. 

Likewise eleven juniors in-
cluded several who were active in 
more than one sport, some also  

• I =a 

Religion I: 
RICHARD FUHRMANN 
Sharon Henscheid 
English I: STEPHEN BECKER 
Craig Voth, Sharon Henscheid 
Spanish I: CRAIG VOTH 
John Mangum, Kelly Schilling 
Special English: 
CHRIS DANGELMAYR 
Carol Reiter 
Speech: DUANE HAVERKAMP 
LeAnn Mollenkopf, 
Kyle Walterscheid 
Trigonometry: GUS REITER 
Stuart Walterscheid, Anne Felderhoff 

Computer: 
SUSAN WALTERSCHEID 
Jeannene Voth, Rita Pels 
Clothing: AMBER GREWING 
Algebra I: CRAIG VOTH 
Shari Voth 
Health: CHRISTY YOSTEN 
Rose Felderhoff, Sondra Hess 
Physics: GUS REITER Rita Pets 

Balfour Runner-up: 
JEANNENE VOTH 
Physical Science: CRAIG VOTH 
Stephen Becker, Richard Fuhrmann 
World Geography 9: 
STEPHEN BECKER 
Sally Stoffels, Craig Voth 
Religion IV: GUS REITER 
Rita Pels, Susan Walterscheid 

Home & Family: 
CARMEN SICKING 
Ron Dangelmayr 
American History: 
TAMMY GREWING 
FOM II: KENT REITER 
Poetry Writing: JIM BARTUSH 
Laura Flusche, Lydia Walterscheid 
Special Biology: KENT REITER 
Tracy Henscheid 

earning all district and state 
qualifier honors. The juniors are 
Chris 	Dangelmayr, 	Carmen 
Daugherty, Rose Felderhoff, 
Darrell Hess, Christy Yosten, 
Sondra Hess, Tim Knabe, Stephen 
Schmitt, Sandy Taylor, Bret 
Walterscheid and Kyle Walter-
scheid. 

Sophomores in the SH uniforms 
were Tim Bartel, Laura Flusche, 
Amber Grewing, Lisa 
Haverkamp, Keith Hennigan, 
Leslie Hess, Ken Hesse, John 
Nasche, Kevin Switzer, Lloyd 
Walterscheid, Lydia Walter- 
scheid, Sandra Walterscheid, 
Paula Yosten, and Charla Bayer. 

And freshmen were Steven 
Becker, Gail Fisher, Beverly 
Haverkamp, Kerry Haverkamp, 
Sharon Henscheid, John Mangum 
and Sally Stoffels. 

Other students recognized were 
drill team leaders Paula Yosten, 
Susan Walterscheid, Jeannene 
Voth and Tammy Grewing; also 
cheerleaders Anne Felderhoff, 
Amber Grewing, Rose Felderhoff, 
Lydia Walterscheid, Sondra Hess 
and Sharon Henscheid. 

Members of the National 
Honor Society are Susan Walter-
scheid, Gus Reiter, Mark Hesse, 
Jeannene Voth, Rita Pels, Neil 
Hesse, Nick Hess, Anne 
Felderhoff, Troy Yosten, Duane 
Haverkamp, Lorene Bartel, Son-
dra Hess, Rose Felderhoff, LeAnn 
Mollenkopf, Kyle Walterscheid, 
Connie Bayer, Christy Yosten, 
Sandy Taylor and Carmen 
Daughtery. 

Special honor titles announced 
at the program were Neil Hesse, 
Mr. Sacred Heart, and Susan 
Walterscheid, Miss Sacred Heart. 

The 	banquet 	fare 	was 
homemade lasagna prepared by 
the Sacred Heart Alumni. 

THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE - MAY 25, 1984 - PAGE 3 

Awards Banquet continued from page 1 

M1011/4441rIE791101/PrAWAV 

114.' 

Religion II: LAURA FLUSCHE 
Paula Yosten, Lydia Walterscheid 
Economics: ANN FELDERHOFF 
Mark Hesse, Susan Walterscheid 
Psychology: ROSE FELDERHOFF 
LeAnn Mollenkopf, Connie Bayer 
Chemistry: 
LE ANN MOLLENKOPF 
Sondra Hess, Connie Bayer 
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Lemons Phomersphy of Nixon. 

MRS. ROBERT WAYNE DOBBS 

Keepsake Pak 
Preserves and 

Protects 
the original beauty 

of your wedding gown 
or other treasures. 

Miller Cleaners 
329 N. Commerce 	t 

665-3201, Gainesville 	6  

Our high yields 
pay more 
money for 

your money. 

That's brass tacks banking. 
I. 	  Compare our yields where you save. 

I 	( 	1 Money 
Fun d 

CD 
. 
CD 

. 

CD CD CD . I 	I) 
- 

Jumbo 
CDs 	. 

I ern) — 
3 

Mos. 
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12 
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18 

Mos. 
24 

Mos. 
30 
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42 

Mos. 
30-365 	• 

Days 

Minimum 52,500 $1,001) $1,000 S1,000 51,000 $1,000 $1,000 S1,000 SI00,000 I 
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Equal interest i - Itcs paid over the 
same term don't ilk\ s get equal 
earnings. Because the way that the 
interest is compounded can affect 
the amount of money you make. 

At Western Savings, we 
compound interest to give 

you the highest possihle vicld. . 

Compare earnings where you save. 
Visit or call a Western Savings 

office listed below, or call us at 
1-800-772-5927 from anywhere ill 

Texas, 	let's get do%\ii 
to brass tacks. 

FSLIC 

WESTERN SAVINGS 
Now wish assets over 5600 million . 

Gainesville n 17 - on -, - os I,. BowieN17,72.2260: Lewisville 214-2217505. Dallas 214- 592 - 1 -,11,. Comm .,,,s 
Malakoff 214-489-1957; Gateaville 817.865-7205; Waco 817-756-2127; Hamilton 817-386-H101; Clifton 

24-al,, 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Muller of Bedford, Texas and formerly of Muen-
ster have announced the engagement and approaching manlage of 
their daughter Vickie to Monty Brouse, son of Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Brouse of Keller, Texas. Vickie Is also the granddaughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. John Hacker of Muenster and the late Mr. and Mrs. Matt 
Muller. The couple will be married in Immaculate Conception 
Catholic Church in Denton on June 16 at 7 p.m. Attendants will be 
Renee Muller, maid of honor; Debbie Lain, both bride's sisters; Mary 
Hedgpeth and Kim Autrey, friends as the three bridesmaids. Also 
Mike Brouse best man, Russell Brouse, Greg Brouse, groom's 
brothers and Richard Smith a friend as groomsmen. Erin Meyers will 
be flower girl and Maurus Hacker, Jr. of Muenster will be ring bearer. 
The bride-elect is a student at North Texas State University and Is em-
ployed part-time at a cleaners in Irving. The future groom is employed 
at Sack-N-Save In Denton as Perishables Manager. The couple will 
reside in Lewisville. 

Our Pre-Arranged Funeral Plans 

Can Save You Money 

and 

Are a Protection Against Inflation 

VERNIE KEEL FUNERAL HOME 
EARL W. CLEMENT 

California at Grand 	Gainesville 	:a.su i 
	665-4341 
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Zimmerer and Dobbs exchanges vows in nuptial 

The wedding of Nancy Sue 
Zimmerer and Robert Wayne 
Dobbs of Gainesville was held in 
St. Peter's Church of Lindsay on 
Saturday May 19 at 5 p.m. 

Father Cletus Post celebrated 
the Nuptial Mass and officiated 
for the double ring vows. 

The bride is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. William J. Zimmerer of 
Rt. 2 and the groom is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert E. Dobbs of 
Gainesville. 

A graduate of Lindsay High 
School, the bride is attending 
Cooke County College and is em-
ployed as a secretary by Bomber 
Bait Co. The groom is a graduate  

of Gainesville High School, atten-
ded Cooke County College and is 
a stocker at Tom Thumb. 

Presented at the altar by her 
father, the bride was wearing a 
white designer gown by Alfred 
Angelo fashioned of silk chiffon 
with a fitted bodice and a Vic-
torian neckline of Wedgewood 
lace, and Schiffli lace forming the 
V-shaped yoke that was edged 
with two wide ruffles of 
Wedgewood and Chantilly laces. 
Full, sheer bishop sleeves were 
cuffed at the wrist with matching 
lace and tied with delicate white 
satin ribbons. The bodice was 
closed in back with tiny white but-
tons. Four wide rows of matching 
lace surrounded the full skirt, 
descending to form the chapel 
length train. 

Her illusion veil was attached 
a white Victorian bridal hat of lace 
with bands of satin and pearls. 

Her bridal bouquet was a 
cascade of red and white roses, 
white babies breath, English ivy 
and white satin streamers. En-
twined was the bride's mother's 
blue rosary, carried at her wed-
ding and also the weddings of the 
bride's sisters. 

For sentiment and tradition, the 
bride wore a ruby ring belonging 
to her maternal grandmother, 
Mrs. Cecilia Hermes. 

Attendants 
Bridal attendants were Diane 

Luttmer of Lindsay, a friend, as 
maid of honor, and Barbara Nor-
tman of Alvin, Texas and Janet 
Bayer of Valley View, sisters of 
the bride, and Laura Headrick of 
Gainesville, cousin of the groom 
as bridesmaids. 

They wore identical gowns of 

red and white designed with a lace 
yoke edged with a red and white 
ruffle. The top skirt was gathered 
at the edge over a deep red ruffle 
and was held in place by red bows. 
Cummerbunds were fitted around 
the gathered skirts. 

Each carried a nosegay of red 
and white carnations and white 
babies breath, with red and white 
streamers. 

Julia Fleitman of Muenster, 
cousin of the bride, was flower 
girl. 

John Hughes of Gainesville a 
friend of the groom was best man. 
Justin Auchter of Spring, Texas, 
groom's nephew, Greg Zimmerer 
of Lindsay, bride's brother and 
Dwight La Rue of Gainesville, a 
friend were groomsmen. 

Michael Zimmerer of Lindsay, 
bride's brother, Chris Bayer of 
Valley View bride's brother-in-
law, Samuel Fleitman of Muen-
ster, bride's cousin and Mickey 
Simmons of Whitesboro, groom's 
cousin were ushers. 

Jerry Brawner of Muenster, 
bride's cousin and Robbie San-
dmann of Lindsay were Mass ser-
vers. 

The altar was decorated with 
arrangements of red and white 
flowers, ferns and candelabra. 
Greenery and lighted votive cand-
les were placed on the communion 
rail. Red and white bows marked 
pews in the center aisle. 

Wedding music included the 
traditional processional and 
recessional by organist Pat Hen-
nigan, Jr. Guitarists were Kenny 
Bezner, Martha Fuhrmann and 
Deana Nortman, joined by 
vocalists Denise and Laura Fuhr-
mann. Selections were "Love," 
"The Wedding Song", "Mother, 
At Thy Feet", "Eres Tu" and 
"Treasures." 

Assisting with the liturgy were lect-
or David Nortman bride's brother-
in-law; Clara Hermes bride's aunt 
and Rudy Dieter as lay ministers. 
Marie Zimmerer and Alcuin 
Zimmerer, bride's godparents, 
presented Offertory gifts. 

Reception 
A reception followed in the 

Knights of Columbus Hall in 
Gainesville. 

Lisa Hess of Lindsay and Lisa 
Sandmann of Dallas presided at 
the bride's book. 

Decorations on all tables in-
cluded red and white flowers made 
by the bride's maternal gran-
dmother, Mrs. Cecilia Hermes. 

The three-tiered wedding cake, 
made and cut by Betty Rose 
Walterscheid, stood over a lighted 
red fountain. On the cake table, 
holding red candles, were crystal 
candleholders, gifts from the 
bride's paternal grandmother, 
Mrs. Rose Zimmerer. The 
groom's cake was cut by Donna 
Zimmerer, bride's sister-in-law. 
Cake servers were Gina Hellman 
and Carol Hermes, bride's cousins 
and Angie Dobbs and Jeanea 

Guests danced to music by Jay 
Anderle and Brad Wimmer. 

Attending from a distance were 
David and Barbara Nortman and 
Michael and Jennifer of Alvin, 
Texas; Paul Flusche of Corpus 
Christi; Sherri Auchter and Justin 
and Melissa of Spring, Texas; 
Renee Braussard and Jason of 
Houston; Joyce Hermes and Scott 
and Kelly of Burnet, Tx. 

The rehearsal dinner, hosted by 
the groom's parents was held on 
Friday, May 18 at K-Bob's in 
Gainesville. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Wayne 
Dobbs are on a wedding trip to 
Jamaica. When they return they 
will be at home in Gainesville. 
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Dr. Pepper 

$139 
6 pack 

12 oz. cans 
Hot only 

Coke 

$139 
6 pack 

12 oz. cans 
Hot only 

..:4,..,_.....-- Great Pr .ces on 	...--„------*,- 
Your Favorite Beer! 

Miller Lite 

Schaefer 

Budweiser Light 

Milwaukee's Best 

Old Milwaukee 

Old Milwaukee Light 

Coors 

Coors Light 

Save Time this Weekend 
On Ready To Go Foods! 

6 a.m. Mon.. Sat. 7 a.m. Sunday 

East Hwy. 82, Muenster, 759 2822 
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Will be OPEN Memorial Day 

10 % Off on all 	rj 
Maternity Summer Shorts, Tops, 

Swim wear, Sun Dresses 

During open house at St. Richard's 
Villa, Joe Hoenig delighted 
residents with a demonstration of 
a folk dance. Activity Director 
Anna Herr, in background, 
"keeps the beat." 

Spring Into Summer Sale 

THE FRAME HOUSE 

THE VINEYARD 

700 East Main, Gainesville, Texas 
10:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m., Mon. - Fri., Sat. 10:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m. 
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MAGNAVOX 
1 9" diagonal 

Remote Control 
Portable 

Color Television 

$5 7 9" 
• 
• 
,e 5 yeaarail e  r parts and picture tube 1   

Gainesville COOKE COUNTY APPLIANCE 
...VOX HOME ENTER TAINMENT CENTER 

E. Hwy. 82, 
Muenster 
759.4411 

COOKE COUNTY 

tY 
LANDSCAPING INC. 

and 

The Greenhouse 
Nursery 

"We're Growing For You" 
300 E. Main 	 Gainesville 	 888.6239 

Short End 
Sale 

at 

The Sewing Center 
205 N. Commerce, 
Gainesville, Texas 

Any piece of fabric with 4 yds. or less, you 

buy it all for Y2 price. 
linings and interfacings not included. 
	 J 

5 gal. Container 

Grown Trees  
Silver Maple 
Fruitless Mulberry 

Bradford Pear 

Reg. $22.50 	Plus More.  

NOW 19" 
American Lawn Fertilizer 

12.4-8 	Reg. $10.50 
50 LB. Bag NOW  $950 

Caladiums 
Pink, White, Red 

Perfect for 
shaded areas 
Reg. 89' 

NOW 7904 
SHRUBS 

Start at $369 
Euonymus 
Juniper 
Nandlna 
Barberry 
And More 

Boxwood 
Waxleaf 
Cleuera 
Holleys 
Photenla 

SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS 

Large Supple of Bedding Plants Still Available 
Purselane 	 Periwinkle 	Rose Moss 

Petunia 	 Marigold 

Complete Landscaping Services for 
Commercial & Residential 
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Open house observes nursing 
home week, Sunday May 20 

Jim Roarks observe 
4 5th anniversary 

St. Richard's Villa observed 
National Nursing Home Week 
with open house on Sunday, May 
20, 2 p.m. to 4 p.m. 

Doug Martin's Band presented 
a program of favorites and Mrs. 
Johnny Fisher played the piano 
and residents sang hymns. 

Cake, punch and coffee were 
served to guests, residents and 
staff. The decorated cake 
prepared by Sue Oakley carried 
the inscription "We love our little 
people. We have them on our 
minds all the time at St. Richard's 

Villa." Serving refreshments were 
Anna Herr activity director, Pat 
Herr, Jean Pagel, Valerie Vogel 
and Tonya Fisher TIA members, 
and Mrs. Eula Grace Cain. 

Guests and residents were 
seated in the front lobby, in the 
dining room and in the front hall. 
Many guests attended but did not 
sign the guest book. Among those 
who signed were Alice Hellman, 
Victoria Gremminger, Della Har- 

tman, Sister Antoinette Fette, Ber- 
tha Pick; Marcia Tate of 

Gainesville; Letha Livingston and 
Dorothy Black both of Myra; Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Smith, Sr. of Valley 
View; Mr. and Mrs. John C. 
Fisher, Mr. and Mrs. Henry Wolf, 
Marcy Wilde, Gertie Horn, Joe 
Hoenig, Ursula Herr, Agnes 
Lehnertz, Debbie Endres; 
daughters of Jennie Schilling; 
Rosa Driever and Toots Huchton 
all of Muenster; Dell Thompson 
and Edna Williams both of Saint 
Jo. 

Johnny and Louise Fisher and 
Randy Barr sent a lovely plant for 
open house in honor of their Aunt 
Bess Barr. 

--- 
On Tuesday, Betty Felderhoff 

showed a movie, furnished by 
Muenster Public Library. 

Volunteers helped conduct 
bingo games on Wednesday. 

Mrs. J.S. Hogan is back at St. 
Richard's since dismissal from 
Muenster Memorial Hospital. 

Alice and Jim Roark observed 
their 45th wedding anniversary on 
Sunday May 20, with a reception 
and buffet supper party in the 
meeting room of the Community 
Center, 7 to 10 p.m. 

Seventy-five guest attended and 
signed the guest book presided by 
Loretta Felderhoff. The buffet 
table was centered with an 
arrangement of daisies, carnations 
and little red lilites created by the 
three Klement sisters at Bouquets 

and Gifts. Marie Endres made 
another arrangement for the 
piano, using flowers she grew in 
her own yard. 

House guest of the Roarks, 
arriving Friday and remaining  

through Monday were her sister 
and brother-in-law Mr. and Mrs. 
John Simpson of Smith Center, 
Kansas; and the two daughters of 
Jim and Alice Roark, Jan Beaver 

of Houston and Mary Ellen Roark 
of Tampa, Florida. The ladies 
each had an orchid corsage. 

Also among guest from out of 
town were Mr. and Mrs. Bill Reed 
of Gainesville. 

The Roarks have lived in Muen-
ster since October 1973, after 
moving from Oklahoma City. She 
is active in community work and 

in the Muenster Garden Club. He 
is 	an 	independent 	electrical 
engineer 	and 	also 	does 
seismograph work. 

Bluebonnets review bike rally 
Visiting Mrs. Agnes Seyler Sunday at St. Richard's Villa were, I to r 
Mmes. Bertha Pick, Alice Hellman, Regina Wolf, Johnann Benner, 
Evelyn Neurer, Agnes Seyler, Agnes Lehnenz and Victoria Grem-
minger. 

End of School 	 
Sidewalk Sale 

at 
THE HUT 

IN MUENSTER 

Saturday Only 10.5 

Many Summer Items On Sale --

Including Selected 
Swim Wear 

Infants - childrens 14 

The 	Bluebonnet 	Extension 
Homemakers 	met 	Monday 
evening, May 14, at 7:30 in the 
home of Mrs. Linda (David) 

Vogel. President Sharon Wolf 
read an inspiration titled "A 
Tribute to Mother". Roll call and 
minutes of the previous meeting 
followed. 

The program consisted of a 
discussion period concerning the 
Annual Bike Rally held in connec-
tion with Germanfest, 1984. 
Michele Knauf, club treasurer, 

gave the report on the receipts and 
expenses of the Bike Rally. All 

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Hess an-
nounce the birth of a daughter, 
Tanya Lorraine, in Muenster 
Memorial Hospital on Wed-
nesday, May 16, 1984 at 3:47 p.m. 
weighing 8 lb. 15 oz. She has two 
brothers, Willie and Waylan. 
Their grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Archie Hess of Muenster and 
Mr. and 'Mrs. Henry Hacker of 
Myra. The great-grandmothers 
are Mrs. Anna Hacker of Muen-
ster and Mrs. Edna Brewster of 
Arkansas. 

--- 
Announcement comes from 

Havelock, North Carolina of a 
new grandchild for Mrs. Lucille 
Hess of Muenster and the late Ray 
Hess. A daughter was born to 
Tom and Paula Hess on May 20, 
1984, weighing 9 lb. 2 oz. The 
mother is the former Paula Mault-
sby of Garner, North Carolina. 
The maternal grandparents are 
Paul and Jean Maultsby. Great-
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry S. Fuhrmann of Lindsay. 
The new baby has been named 
Meghan Louise. 

Schedule of 
Meetings 

AA 
An open meeting of AA, Muen-

ster Chapter will be held Tuesday, 
May 29 in the meeting room of the 
Community Center at 8 p.m. 
Everyone is welcome. 

TIA 
An important ITA meeting to 

elect officers and to discuss the 
Diocesan Youth Convention will 
be held Tuesday, May 29 at 7:30 
p.m. at Anne Poole's home. All 
wishing to attend the convention 
must attend this meeting.  

members contributed ideas and 
suggestions to make next year's 
Rally an even bigger and better 
success. Also discussed at the 

meeting was the Council May 
Luncheon hosted by the Lindsay 
Extension 	Homemakers 	on 

Tuesday, May 8. Plans are being 
made by Charlotte Klement for an 
Underground Shopping Trip to 
Dallas on June 9, for club mem-
bers. 

As in past years, members voted 
to donate profit from Germanfest 
to Non-Profit or Needy 

Al and Sis Felderhoff and Vince 
and Trudy Felderhoff entertained 
business associates, members of 
the oil fraternity, employees of 
Felderhoff Brothers and group of 
relatives and friends Saturday 
evening. 

The party at the Community 
Center included a cocktail hour, 
buffet supper and dance. 

The event was in observance of 
the 35th anniversary of Felderhoff 
Brothers Drilling Company and, 
by coincidence, followed by one 
day the 35th wedding anniversary 
of the Vince Felderhoffs. 

Rohmers catered the meal and 

Organizations or families that 
have endured an unfortunate happ-
ening. It was agreed to give S200 
to the Young Children's Learning 
Center to be used for music sup-
plies and equipment and also help 
on purchase of a computer to be 
used at the Center, $100.00 to the 
Love Fund for the Bill and 
Shawna Sicking Family, and 
$50.00 each to the St. Richard's 
Villa bingo fund, and the 
Vacation Bible Schools at the Bap-
tist and Catholic Churches. 
Refreshments of cake and soft 
drinks were served to 9 members. 

the Will Matthews Band played 
for dancing. 

MAP hosts annual 
picnic on June 24 

MAP will host its annual picnic 
on Sunday, June 24 at 4 p.m. in 
the pavilion of Muenster City 
Park. All senior citizens are in-
vited and are asked to bring a 
covered dish. Cold drinks and 
fried chicken will be provided by 
MAP. The meal will be served at 6 
p.m. All who are interested in 
table games are asked to bring 
cards or dominoes and possibly a 
few card tables. 

Felderhoff Brothers observe 
35th year in oil business 
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	  MUENSTER n in 	Cable TV 
America n Fern iy Creme! 

''I'm 
earning 
insured 
Tax-Free 
Interest 
of . . . 

1 0.10% 
Effective May 24, 1944 

by Investing In Insured Municipal Income Trust." 
"My Edward D. Jones & Co. broker showed me the advantages - 

• Insured investment 	 • AAA-raring 
• Convenience of no clipping coupons or bookkeeping 

• Monthly, quarterly, or semi-annual interest." 
Please call or star 	'thee''' 	 nlormafrOn 

EARL "RUSTY" RUSSELL 
First State Bank Bldg.. 
Gainesville, Tx 

(817) 759-4942. 665-0351 

WVIII Edward 
a Jones 
& Co. 

EARL L RUSSELL 
1. -The rating Is due to an Insurance policy and relates only to the bond• 
In the portfolio and not to the units of the trust. The Insurance does not 
remove market rife •Ince It dorm not guarantor the menet value of the 
units. The details of the Insurance policy are more fully described In the 
prospectus. No representation Is made as to the insurers ability to meet 
its commitment." 
2. -The return represents the net annual Interest. after annual expenses 
divided by the public offering price II varies with changes In either 
amount and with particular payment options " 
3 "Portions of the income may be subject to state and local taxes  

This Is neither an offer to sell nor • solicitation of en offer to buy any 
units of the Fund The offering of Unit• is made only by the prospectus 
and only In those sates In which Units may legally be offered 

GRAND OPENING 

BRONCO BELT CO. 
Western Belt, Buckle and Gift Store 

Texas and Oklahoma Souvenirs 
Gift Wrapping Available 

Quality Western Belts For The Entire Family 
Over 1000 In Stock 

• Quality Leathers 	 Prices Start At 

• Exotic Skins 
• Famous Name Brands $ 1 95 
• Sizes 28 to 46 

FREE Name Imprint — While You Wait 

Western Belts 
For Children 

• Free Name Imprint 
• Many Assorted Styles 

GRAND OPENING SPECIAL 

A FREE Western Belt Buckle 
With Each Child's Belt Purchase 

(size 18 to 26) 

Special Value 

Twister 
Beads 

Twister 
Beads 

New Spring Colors 
Fossil Bead Only 

  

2 9 5ea c h 	$39P.. 
5.10 3.10 

BRONCO BELT CO. 
Located In The Gainesville Shopping Center 

Locally Owned By Tim Marlin and Ronnie Taylor 
Managed by Kathy Proffitt 
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VFW Auxiliary installs officers 
Installation of officers of the 

VFW Auxiliary by Ethel Hesse 
was held during the May meeting 
of the organization. They in-
cluded: Frances Bayer president, 
Rose Hudspeth senior vice 
president; Josephine Schilling 
junior vice president; Ethel Hesse 
treasurer; Linda Knabe conduc-
tress; Flora Mae Knabe chaplain; 
Marie Herr guard: Peggy Walter-
scheid one year trustee; Dorothy 
Swirczynski two year trustee and 
Jackie Bilderback three year 
trustee. 

Appointive officers are Ida 
Bindel secretary, Agnes Hesse 
patriotic instructor, Lou Voth 
historian, Janet Barnhill banner 
bearer, Liz Koester flag bearer, 
and four color bearers Hilda 
Sicking, Marie Walter, Rosa 
Driever, and Lajuana Klement. 

Frances Bayer presided for the 
business meeting. Agnes Hesse 
was patriotic instructor pro tern. 

Two new members, Gerri 
Walterscheid and daughter 
Delania were welcomed. 

Delegates to the state conven-
tion in Amarillo on June 22-24 
were named, including Frances 
Bayer, Josephine Schilling, Marie 
Herr, Ethel Hesse, Lou Voth and 
Flora Mae Knabe. 

Communications included a let-
ter from State Representative-elect 
Richard Williamson, a letter from 
Volunteer Services at Denton 
State School and an invitation to 
the opening of the William Zale 
Water Therapy Center on June 10. 
Also State Commander Andy 
Stelzer accepted an invitation to 
attend Memorial Services at 

Special Announcement 
Coming events announced by 

Linda Knabe include I. sale of 
Buddy Poppies by the VFW 
Auxiliary at all Sunday Masses. 

2. Practice for Memorial Day 
procession will be held Saturday 
May 26 at 10 a.m. at Sacred Heart 
Cemetery. All First Communican-
ts who have been contacted and 
auxiliary officers are asked to at-
tend this important practice 
session. 

3. All participating First Com-
municants will meet at the west 
entrance of Sacred Heart Church 
at 7:30 a.m. to be ready for the 
procession to the cemetery for 
Memorial services. All cub scouts 
are asked to join, also. 

Sacred Heart Cemetery on May 
27. 

Members signed get-well cards 
for Pearl Evans and Ruth 
Needham. Frances Bayer reported 
the presentation of a Teacher's 
Appreciation Award to Dorothy 
Bengfort, 8th grade teacher at 
Sacred Heart School, on May 9. 

The report of the District I con-
vention told of the atendance by 
Mrs. Ethel Hesse, Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Bayer, Mr. and Mrs. Her-
bie Herr, Mr. and Mrs. Arnold 
Schilling, and Pat Knabe. Mary 
Lu Ritchie of Denison is new 
district president and will attend 
the June meeting of the VFW 

	

The 	annual 	Muller-Herr 
reunions will be held Sunday, may 
27 in the pavilion of Muenster 
City Park, for a noon meal and 
supper. Bring covered dishes and 
drinks for your family. 

--- 
On Sunday, June 3, descendan-

ts of the late Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Hoedebeck, Sr. will meet for their 

Frontier Manor News 

"Kiowa Kardinals" Sing 
On May 8, Frontier Manor 

residents were entertained by the 
"Kiowa Kardinals" of Lake 
Kiowa, Texas. These Ladies just 
enjoy singing and sharing music 
with others. The group was 
organized in 1980. 

Choir director Geneva James, 
also plays the piano for the group. 
These ladies come to Texas from 
Ohio, Montana, Arizona, Okla., 
Illinois, and a few come from 
Texas. They represent all 
demoninations of faith and in-
terests. They sing at functions at 
the lake on the 4th of July, 
Christmas, Thanksgiving and the 
annual Firemens Follies. 

They are all great ladies and en-
joy themselves very much. 

Our residents enjoy hearing 
them and so does the staff. We 
wish they would practice on us. 
We would enjoy being their 
listening posts. 

The ladies singing today in-
cluded Geneva james, Hazel 
Kossman, Marion Reeder, Bar-
bara Rush, Betty Malugin, Mary 
Ellen Wolfe, and Eddye Wyatt. 

Auxiliary. 	The 	next 	district 
meeting will be in Sherman on 
August 4-5. Received at the 
district convention was a cer-
tificate of 100 07o reporting on 
rehabilitation. 

Plans for Memorial Day ser-
vices were outlined. Members will 
sell Buddy Poppies after all chur-
ch services next Sunday. 

Ethel Hesse gave the treasurer's 
report. Josephine Schilling served 
refreshments to 20 members. 
Agnes Hesse volunteered as 
refreshment hostess for June. 
Rose Hudspeth won the door 
prize. 

annual reunion in the pavilion of 
Muenster City Park. A covered 
dish dinner will be served at noon. 
Families will furnish their own 
drinks. For more information call 
Gene Hoedebeck 759-2716. 

- -- 
Descendants of the late Mr. and 

Mrs. Henry Fleitman will hold a 
reunion for the relationship on 
Sunday, June 10 in Muenster City 
Park beginning at II a.m. with 
dinner at noon. All attending are 
asked to bring drinks and a 
covered dish for the meal. Phone 
Eddie Fleitman 759-2773 or 
Wilfred Bindel 759-2729 for more 
information. 

- -- 
A family reunion will be held on 

Sunday, June 10 at Muenster City 
Park for descendants of the late 
Frank and Mary Hess. Those at-
tending are asked to bring covered 
dishes and drinks for the noon 
meal. For more information, call 
Don Hess 759-2744 or 759-4310. 

YHT sees film, 
plans summer activities 

Members of the Muenster chap-
ter of Young Homemakers of 
Texas met on May 7 at 7:30 p.m. 
in the Muenster High School 
home economics room to view a 
film "Decorating With Color and 
Patterns" by Armstrong. The film 
demonstrated how to select a color 
and pattern scheme, and then use 
both to coordinate floors, walls, 
furniture and other accessories. 

After the film, Joni Sturm, 
YHT adviser, instructed the group 
on how to assemble a "no sew" 
pillow. 

The business meeting was 
opened with the official ceremony 
led by Janie Hartman, president. 
A prospective new member, 
Tommie Sue Muerer, was in-
troduced to the group. 

June Bartush, treasurer, gave a 
report on the profits from the 
Germanfest Bake Sale. Special 
thanks were expressed  to  all mem-
bers for making the project a suc-
cess by each baking more than was 
required. 

Other business included selec-
tion of kits to order for making 
fabric photo frames at the June 14 
meeting. Plans were discussed for 
the annual summer social to be 
held in July. 

Final business was to appoint a 
nominating committee for a new 
slate of officers, who will be elec-
ted at the June 14 meeting. 

Janie Hartman used the official 
closing ceremony for the closing 
of the chapter meeting. 

Yosten Baptism 
Kristen Rose Yosten, infant 

daughter of James and Susan 
Yosten was baptized in Sacred 
Heart Church at noon Sunday, 
May 20 by Father Denis Soerries. 

Her baptismal sponsors were an 
aunt and uncle, Carol Lin Koester 
and Ronny Yosten. Kristen wore 
her mother's christening gown, 
also worn by her two brothers at 
their baptism and handmade by 
her great-grandmother, Mrs. Ben 
Voth. 

Attending the baptism with the 
parents and sponsors were 
Kristen's brothers Nicholas and 
Jonathan, the grandparents Mr. 
and Mrs. Alfons Koesler and Mr. 
and Mrs. Werner Yosten, the 
great grandmother Mrs. Ben Voth 
and uncles and aunts, Chris 
Yosten, Joe, Barbara and Max 
Koester, Mary and Duane Knabe, 
Mrs. Tommy Knabe and Stephen. 
All attended a family gathering at 
the James Yosten home following 
the baptism. 

Tanya is 5 
Tanya Renee Knauf was five 

years old on April 28 and 
celebrated with a party on April 23 
in the home of her parents, Bob 
and Michele Knauf. 

The party featured a Smurfette 
birthday cake made by Betty Rose 
Walterscheid. A special attraction 
for the twelve little guests was a 
Smurfette pinata brought back 
from Mexico by Tanya's parents. 

On Thursday April 26 Tanya 
had her celebration of life at The 
Young Children's Learning Cen-
ter. Her mother told of significant 
events that have taken place 
during her five year's of life. The 
children were then served cup-
cakes and punch. 

Special guests for Tanya on her 
birthday were her godparents Mr. 
and Mrs. Paul Bauer and their son 
Eric of Harlingen. They enjoyed 
the Germanfest and following 
week with Tanya and her family. 

Attend Confirmation 
in Rockwall 

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Wolf 
were in Rockwall during the 
weekend to attend the Confir-
mation of a granddaughter, 
Kristin Kupper, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leroy Kupper. The Mass 
and administering of the 
Sacrament were held in Our Lady 
of the Lake Church in Rockwall at 
5 p.m. on Saturday. 

Kristin's Confirmation sponsor 
was an aunt, Mrs. Julie Klement 
of McAllen. There were 39 con-
firmants in the class. 

Also attending were Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Kupper and family of 
Valley View, Mr. and Mrs. 
Truman Wolf and family of 
Dallas and Kristin's friend, Kristin 
Giles of Rockwall. All were sup-
per guests in the Leroy Kupper 
home. 

Sharon Wolf, at right presents a 
check for 5200 from the Bluebon-
net Extension Homemakers to 
Patti Bayer and Loretta 
Felderhoff of the Young 
Children's Learning Center to 
help toward purchase of a com-
puter and supplies for teaching 
music. 

Michelle Knauf at right, member 
of the Bluebonnet Extension 
Homemakers, presents a check for 
$50 to Anna Herr, activity direc-
tor at St. Richard's Villa, for use 
in bingo prizes for residents, in 
observance of National Nursing 
Home Week. 

News of 
the Sick 

Pearl Evans returned home 
Friday, May 18, after dismissal 
from Baylor Hospital in Dallas 
where she was a surgical patient. 
She is making a normal recovery 
and feeling fine. 

ONLY THE BEST ON ... 
Scants,. at., 28 3 00 aw100 

W.:147  gal Rit""k•WAR t. 34a°""ni"" 
Matthew Broderick stars 
as David Lightman, a teen-
ager whose brilliant know-
ledge of computers gets 
rum into a "game -  far 
more dangerous than ne 
ever suspected. Also star-
ring Dabney Coleman 

To order call 
759-2251 
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Diamonds for 
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Seiko, Pulsar, Wove, Lorus 
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40% off 
Most of our diamonds 
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VCR  
 MOVIE SHOWCASE 

Rent your V.C.R. units and movies from 
the newest place in town. We have the 
newest releases on the market with one 
of the best selections of movies in North 
Texas. Free Movie Club 

Membership if you qualify. 
Located In Gainesville Shopping Center, 

930 E. Hwy. 82, 
Neat to Radio Shack, 

Phone 665-1052 



Geo. J. Carroll 
& Son 

Funeral Home 
"Serving Cooke County 

Since 1900 -  

6653455, 802 Lindsey St. 
Gainesville, TO. 

Ceramic 

Shop  

HOURS: 
MON.. TUES., 8 FRI., 10-6 

CLOSED WEDNESDAY 
THURSDAY 12-9 
SATURDAY 11.3 

SUNDAY 2-5 

1817) 759 - 2581 
E Hwy 82 	 P.O. Box 432 

How to pay 
medical bills when 

Medicare isn't enough. 
More senior citizens are turning to New York Life's new Medi-

care Supplement Policy because it is designed to help pay what 
Medicare doesn't. 

No medical examination to take; renewable for life; and adjust-
ments are guaranteed if Medicare changes. 

I'll be glad to give you more details. 

WALLACE INGLISH 
New York Life Insurance Company 

1105 Olive St., Gainesville 

817-665-5863 
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The Pool & Spa Place 

SPRING 
START-UP 

SPECIALS 
FIBERGLASS POOLS 

VINYL POOLS 

Spas — Chemicals — Accessories 
Service And Repair 

Since 1975 

9 a.m. - 5 p.m. Tuesday - Friday 
9 a.m. - 1 p.m. Saturday 

Closed Monday 

THIS IS OUR ONLY BUSINESS 
316 E. Calif. (Across from the Post Office), Gainesville 

665-1100 Evenings, 1-214-429-6708 Woodbine 25.2171 

ENROLLMENT FORM 
Child's Name 	 Parents 
Age 	  
Grade level School yr 83-84 	Address 
Birth Date 	 Phone 	  

VOLUNTEERS 
Count on me to help in Vacation Bible School: I will serve as .... 

	Teacher or Teacher Aide _Music Helper 
	Refreshment Supplier 	Refreshment Chairman 
	Classroom Helper 	Cleanup Committee 

	Craft Helper 
_Nursery Helper 
	Telephone Committee 

Any questions call 759-2555 Margie Klement, 759-4377 Michele 
Knauf; 759-4884 Becky Felderhoff 

Travis Trachta is first communicant 
The First Communion Day for 	St. Elizabeth Seton Church was 

Travis Trachta was on Saturday, decorated with items the children 
May 5 at 3:30 p.m. Father Glenn made. A "stairway to heaven" 
D. Gardner was celebrant of the was made of cut-out handprints of 
special Mass in St. Elizabeth Seton each First Communicant. 
Catholic Church in Plano for a 	Candles on the altar were made 
class of 100 second graders. 	by the children. Arrangements of 

tissue paper flowers used in chur- 
Attending the service were ch were later given to parents. 

Travis' parents Tom and Sue Father Glenn D. Gardner's Mass 
Trachta and daughter, Michelle; vestment was made and decorated 
the grandparents Dave and Georgi with paint by the children. 
Mae Trachta and J.P. and Hazel 	Following the church service, 
Flusche and son, Bill; godfather the Tom Trachtas hosted a 
Hank Trachta and his wife Kathy chicken dinner in their home for 
and their daughter Lynsi of The their guests. 
Colony; the godmother Marge 	The First Communion cake, by 
Clement was unable to attend but Betty Rose Walterscheid, was 
sent her greetings. Also attending brought by the Trachta gran-
were aunts, Sharon Boruff and dparents, and was served for 
daughter Tracy of Dallas and dessert. 
Jeannine Flusche and sons Mark 	Travis enjoyed opening his gifts 
and Michael of Muenster. 	 and playing with his cousins. 

SAVE 20% 
on all 
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Drapes 
Woven Woods 

Mini Blinds 
Verticals 
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209 N. Main, 	 Muenster 

ti 

0: V 

r 

t t  

759-2848 

Happy Birthday, Joe Hennigan 

Let's Get Away 
Obviously there are many choices but the "right choice" can be made with a visit to our 
agency. Stop in for a wide range of attractive brochures and the right advice 

"Wherever your travels take you. let us help" 

817 
665-1712 

the travel ,,,,  alga *au 107 East California 
Gainesville 
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Graduation attracts visitors Sacred Heart plans vacation 
bible school, July 23-27 Dan Per Stevensons 

are on Texas visit 
Mr. and Mrs. Dan Per Stevenson 

and son Nathaniel have arrived 
from their job in Saudi Arabia for 

Beltone's 
New Ode 
Is Changing the 
Way People 
Feel About 
Hearing Aids 

If one of the reasons why 
you've put off getting a hear-
ing aid is size, then you must 
see and try Beltone's Ode. The 
Ode is a canal aid. It fits dir-
ectly into your ear canal. 
There are no tubes, no wires, 
virtually nothing showing. 

Call your Beltone hearing aid 
specialist today for a free de-
monstration. And see if the 
Ode is right for you. 

The Mobile Testing & Service Unit 
is in Muenster every Monday 

from 1 to 2 p.m. at 

Muenster Pharmacy, 
511 North Maple Street 

759 2833. Of 

Gainesville. 665 8172 

a month's visit with her parents, 
the Lee Roy Yostens in Muenster 
and his parents, Col. and Mrs. 
James Stevenson of Lake Kiowa. 
Mrs. Dan Per Stevenson is the 
former Karla Yosten. 

On Sunday they were joined by 
Arnold and Kathy Yosten and 
daughter Rachel of Fort Worth to 
attend the high school graduation 
of Troy Yosten at Sacred Heart 
Church. 

Following graduation services, 
they all returned to the Lee Roy 
Yosten home for a family 
gathering. Joining them were 
Gene and Linda Yosten and sons 
Jeffrey and Jeremy of Muenster 
and Kerri Yosten of the home. 

--- 
Cathy Creed and daughter 

Kristen of Gainesville visited her 
parents, the Victor Sickings Sun-
day and attended the graduation 
of her sister, Carmen Leah Sicking 
from SHHS. 

--- 
Out of town guests of Mr. and 

Mrs. Jerry Reiter and family to at-
tend the graduation of Gus Reiter 
were Gloria Sprencel and 
daughters Georgia, Kathy, Susie 
and Bonnie of Perrin, Texas. Also 
Mr. and Mrs. John Schmidlkofer 
of Lindsay, Joe and Viola Sch-
midlkofer and daughter Joan and 
Mrs. Paul Hess and daughter 
Sherri of Lindsay. 

--- 
Guests of Mrs. Ethel Hesse, 

coming to attend the graduation 
of Mark Hesse were Marge and 
Billy Devers and children of 
Valley View and Charles and Joan 
Golaz and children of Paradise, 
Texas. 

--- 
Doreen and Steve Taylor and 

son Nicholas of Iowa Park were 
guests of her mother, Mrs. Regina 

Pels, coming to attend the 
graduation of Rita Pels. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Tony Hess enter-

tained members of her family who 
came from out of town to attend 
the graduation of Nick Hess, in-
cluding Mr. and Mrs. Randy Stof-
fels and family of Gainesville, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Stoffels, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pete Stoffels, Mr. and 
Mrs. Norbert Zimmerer, Dorothy 
Bengfort and Wilfred Bengfort, 
all of Lindsay. 

- -- 
Mary Beth Bartush of Tulsa and 

Joe Bartush and Cathy Bartush 
both of Dallas were weekend 
guests of their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Bartush, Sr. They 
also attended the graduation of 
their brother, Jim Bartush in 
Sacred Heart Church Sunday 
evening. 

- -- 
Guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ray 

Voth coming to attend the 
graduation of Jeannene Voth 
from SHHS were Mr. and Mrs. 
John Voth of Gainesville, and 
Brenda and Steve Fuhrmann and 
daughters Andrea and DeAnn of 
Lindsay. 

--- 
Mrs. Jim Myrick of Lindsay 

and Mr. and Mrs. Jim Eckert, 
who are in the process of moving 
to Muenster from New Mexico 
were out-of-town guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bernard Hesse, coming 
for Neil Hesse's graduation Sun-
day evening. 

- -- 
Little Ricky and Sue Stulz of 

Sanger were graduation guests of 
Susan Walterscheid and the Nor-
bet Walterscheids. 

- -- 
Roddy Berend of Friona was a 

wee' ' ,id guest of the Ted Hen-
schel, family and attended the 
graduation of his cousin, Brad 
Henscheid Sunday evening. Rod-
dy is the son of Jo Ann and Leroy 
Berend of Friona. 

- -- 
Please send in more news of 
graduation guests, for use in next 
week's paper. 

A family reunion developed 
recently in the home of Mrs. 
Agnes Lehnertz, whose children 
arrived over a two week period for 
visiting and attendance at Ger-
manfest, when all were together at 
the same time for several days. 

Particularly enjoyed were their 
visits with old school friends, 

Library News 
"Magical Mysteries" at 
Muenster Public Library 

"Magical Mysteries,-" the 1984 
Texas Reading Club, offers a 
summer of reading fun at the 
Muenster Public Library. The 
Club's theme will focus on 
mysteries, magic and adventure 
stories, fantasy, folklore and fairy 
tales, monsters, mysteries of 
nature, and on and on. The 
Reading Club strives to promote 
reading and the enjoyment of 
books, and to familiarize children 
and their parents with the library 
and its services. Children between 
the ages of three and thirteen who 
join the Club will receive a book-
mark and a reading log to record 
books read. Those who complete 
the reading requirements, which is 
to read 10 books on your grade 
level, will receive a "Magical 
Mysteries Certificate" and a 
FREE Paperback. The library 
staff has compiled a book list per-
taining to this theme. Check it for 
assistance in your selection of 
books to read. 

The Reading Club officially 
starts on Tuesday, May 29 and 
Concludes on Thursday, August 
2. The Texas Reading Club is 
jointly sponsored by the Texas 
State Library and public libraries 
throughout the State. Membership 
is free. 

Library hours: Tuesday 8:30 to 
5:00, Wednesday 2:30 to 5:30, 
Thursday 8:30 to 5:00. 

Matthew is three 

Matthew Edward York is three 
years old. He is the son of Margie 
and C. Ed York of Buckhurst 
Hill, Essex, England and the 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Felderhoff Sr. of Muenster. 

He celebrated his birthday with 
a party in his home on Sunday, 
May 6 in England. Seven 
playmates attended. Decorations 
were of an English "Mr. Men" 
theme. 

The children played games for 
prizes in the back garden. Mat-
thew's father grilled hot dogs for 
their tea and then they enjoyed ice 
cream and the decorated birthday 
cake made by his mother. 

On his actual May 10 birthday 
his playschool class honored him 
with a celebration, and refresh-
ments of chocolate cupcakes and 
milk. 

Matthew plans 	another bir- 
thday celebration when he arrives 
in Texas for a three week holiday 
beginning May 24. He will be ac-
companied by his mother Margie 
York, (formerly Margie 
Felderhoff of Muenster) and his 
three and a half month old baby 
brother, Christopher, to visit in 
the home of parents and gran-
dparents, Tommy and Barbara 
Felderhoff. His father will be 
unable to accompany them, but 
must remain in London for his 
work.  

relatives and former neighbors. 
Only family member missing 

was Floyd Lehnertz of Saunder-
stown, Rhode Island. He was in-
jured sometime before planning to 
come to Texas, when he fell from 
a 3 story building while repairing a 
roof. He received extensive in-
juries to an arm, a leg and ver-
tebrae. Although dismissed from 
hospital care, he is confined to his 
home before receiving further 
treatment. 

All other family members in-
cluded Mr. and Mrs. Jim Lehnertz 
and Cheryl of Gainesville, Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Lehnertz of Bossier 
City, la., Gene Lehnertz of 
Spokatte, Wa., G.M. Lehnertz of 
Tyler, David Lehnertz of 
Spokane, Jane Ross of Spokane, 
Dolly Shively and daughter Cathy 
Garrison of Memphis, Tenn., Mr. 
and Mrs. Quintin Lehnertz of 
Spokane, and Don Lehnertz and 
Claude Lehnertz all of Spokane. 

SNAP honors 
two birthdays 

May birthday honorees at 
SNAP were Mrs. Eleanor 
Wiesman and John Fleitman. A 
decorated birthday cake by Betty 
Rose Walterscheid was served af-
ter the regular SNAP lunch. Pic-
ture taking and table games 
followed. 

Senior Citizens 
express thanks 

The Muenster Senior Citizens 
have expressed appreciation to 
Muenster businesses for wonder-
ful support and help in placing ads 
in the program booklets, inlcuding 
Felderhoff Bros. Drilling Com-
pany, Muenster Milling Com-
pany, H&W Meat Company, 
Fischer's Meat Market, The Cen-
ter Restaurant and Tavern among 
many others from Lindsay and 
Gainesville. 

An all new and exciting 
program has been prepared by 
Sacred Heart Church for Vacation 
Bible School to be held July 23 
through July 27. "JESUS IS MY 
ANSWER" is the theme for the 
school, to be held each weekday 
from 9:00 to 11:30. 

Children four years of age by 
May 31 to those who have com-
pleted the 5th grade will be 
challenged and involved through 
such activities as these: song time, 
Bible study, interesting visual 
demonstrations, classroom in- 

Selection was made from the 
three graduating classes at the 
university including those in 
August and December 1983 and 
May 1984. She received the 
Glenadene Byrns McKibben Out-
standing School of Education 
Award, a monetary prize and a 
commemorative plaque. 

Lou received her Bachelor of 
Science degree in Elementary  

teraction, craft making, and many 
other innovative methods in 
keeping with the theme, "JESUS 
IS MY ANSWER." 

The challenging lessons are cen-
tered on the parables of Jesus and 
the ways in which those grand 
teachings provide us answers to 
life's problems. 

Please fill out and return the 
following enrollment form by 
dropping it in the collection basket 
at Sacred Heart Church or mail 
to: Michele Knauf, Route 1, Box 
113, Muenster, TX 76252. 

Family reunions at 
Agnes Lehnertz 

Stephen F. Austin U. honors Lou Dyer 
Lou Ann Dyer was named on Education in December '83 and 

May 12 as the Outstanding graduated with high honors and a 
Student in the School of maximum 4.0 average. 
Education in Stephen F. Austin 	She is a 1980 graduate of Muen- 
State University in Nacogdoches. ster High School and a 1982 
She was among a group of studen- graduate of Cooke County 
is from the various departments of College and is currently studying 
the university receiving special for her master's degree at Stephen 
recognition at a luncheon hosted F. Austin, and plans to teach this 
by the Alumni Association. 	fall. At SFASU she was a member 

of Kappa Delta Pi, honorary 
organization 	for 	education 
majors, and Alpha Chi, honorary 
organization 	for 	outstanding 
academic attainments. 

Lou's parents, Edgar and Carol 
Dyer attended the luncheon and 
awards program on May 12. 



Arm Roast 	 18. $ 1 " 

...L '2 2 4  

5t. 99' 

3.. °1 " 

ROLL 99' 

5 ,0, 9 9 ' 

WELCHS 

Grape Juice 
AMERICAN BEAUTY 

Flour 

Crisco Oil 
NICE & SOFT 

Tissue 
ASSORTED PLANTERS 

Snacks 

32 OZ. 
JAB 

929 

311 $ 1 00 

1-LB. CARTON 

Biscuits =AZT—  s" 
Velveeta Cheese 

Quarters 

KRAFT HALF MOON 

Cheddar Cheese 

304 N. Main, Muenster, 759-4211, 759-4217 'IL' Prices effective May 24 thru May 30, 1984 

Since 
1927 

flirat ftlaritrt 

FISCHER'S FULLY COOKED SMOKED SS BEEF. 14 PORK 

Sausage 	  LB 8 1" 
FISCHER'S GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Chuck Steak 	 LB $ 1 " 

FISCHER'S 

Ground Chuck 	 LB $ 1 " 

FISCHER'S GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

> 	FROZEN FOODS 

PIC 794  1/6111 
MINIM IISSOOTEI 

Dinners 11 CZ $ 
TREESWEET ORANGE 

Juice 	,200 '1" 
ASSORTED TORTS 

Pizza 	20' off 

Lemonade 211.'s 	oo 

try our 

Cherry Black Forest 
Cake or 

German Cheese Cake 
$800 

. . 

ROUND CARTON.'  \ 
SHURFFIESH 

Ice Cream\ 
139 

USDA CHOICE HEAVY BEEF 

BONELESS 

BRISKET 

HEL MUT S 

Taco Links 	 LB $ 1 " 

MEMORIAL 

39 

$ 100 

$ 1 00 

$149 

$ 1 00 

79 4  
$ 1 00 

794  
$ 1 00 

BREEZE 

Detergent 	'2" 
DISH DETERGENT 

Dawn Liquid 22 OL $ 1 29  

FINEST QUALITY FRESH FROSTED 

Fryer Leg 
hind 

Quarters. 0.59c 

MEATS 

461e717( -1 1 0 OZ. 

Dr. Pepper 
LIMIT 4 

FISCHER S 

PORK CHOPS 

SNORFINE CHARCOAL 

	  Lighter 320199 '  

' irSHURFINE CHARCOAI. 

BRIQUETS 

Center Loin 	 LB $ 1 7 9 
Center Rib 	  

, 	.  	 Ribs 	LB *1 "  * 

*1"

*
4, 

LB 

LB 

v 

$ 1 49  

COUNTRY STYLE SPARE 

1 St Cut 	 

* 	
----_------ ---.-.... 

Homo Milk 
SHURFRESH 

UNIT 1 MITRE PURCHASE 
OF 050.90 ON MORE 

HELMUTS 

Polish Sausage 	 LB. 1 9 9 60a 

HOLIDAY WEEKEND  

FOOD SPECIALS 

> "SPARKLING FRESH" PRODUCE  

NOR. FANCY RER PELICIHUS 

FANCY FLORIDA 

Sweet Corn 	5 FOR 
SUNKIST 

Red Grapefruit 	5 LI 
BAC 

CALIFORNIA CALAYO 

Avocados tlan 	5 _ FOR 

CALIFORNIA SNOWIALL 

Cauliflower 	LI. 
CALIFORNIA 

Nectarines 	LA. 

Fasntaloupes 	LI. 
JBI90 ITALIAN 

Red Sweet Onions L. 

oarawie 

FRESH CRISP 

ICEBERG 
LETTUCE1 ‘ ,3  

FOR 	
0  4  

OR   

4 

L. 39t 

MILK 

Sauce 	5:alis 
SWIFT VIENNA 

Sausage 2s 
SNINFINE PORE 

Instant Tea 3 :liM 
CARNATION 

Milk 	 2"..84 
IleCORMICK Wet 

OZ. Pepper 	4 CAR 
UI KU MIRTH 

Cat Food 2 
HEAVY DUTY 26 FT. ROLL 

Reynolds Foil 
REG. M LETS Mis.1 Vogrtaelos 

Veg All 2' 

I 	FISCHER'S PORK t Smoked S  Sausage 
	  LB 

$ 1 8 9 

SURFINE 

Mustard 
WOLF HOT DOG 

Sauce 
SIIIRFINE ALL MISS 

Coffee 
STARKIST 

Chunk Tuna 
SNORER. CHEESE 

Spam IX"  

POLISH OR KOSHER 8111, 11 AAAAA I SILL 

Vlasic Pickles 
SNURFRESN Rog. .r Sip 

Potato Chips 2 "' 
WHEW PORE I 

Beans 

DELMONTE 

KETCHUP 
$ di 19 

32 OZ. 

4 

FRESNLIKE 

Peas 211 
FRISKER' 

Spinach 3"::: 
CORN MUFFIN III 

Jiffy 	4 5.::11. 
ICE CREAM 

Salt 	OLDS. 59 4  
EAGLE 

$ 1 5 Milk 	14 M 

NAL KIN ASSURE 

Dog Food 2 1 :Ns 78' 
MIS ROLL 

Hi-Dri Towels 58' 
DELTA Merl 

Napkins 'Pr. 
HISN DETERGENT 

Dawn Liquid 

$ 1 00 

929 

s l op 

AFFILIATED 

QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED 

Paper Plates 
Bluebird 9 Inch 

L imin  100 CT. 
PKG. 

$ 1 00 

$ 1 59 

1 00 

69' 
99' 
49' 
49 4  

31 02. 
JAR 

3110s 

59 4  
$ 1 00 

1 LA. 
CAN $ 1 79  

8.0 02. 
CAR 78' 

1202. $129 
CAE 

PIE .  

PIE 68' 

2— 12 OZ., 12 PACK 

MILLER LITE 
BEER 
$999 

Great 
Taste... 
Less 
Filling 

wine -1W, 4s- 
6 1 03 

$ 1 2 9 

Health And Beauty Aids  

COPPERTORE 

Lotion Or Oil 	IR 
402 $299 

REVLON NOR SHAMPOO OR 

Conditioner 	1 01 $229 

RATER 

Aspirin Tablets'"‘ 	999 

FRANKS PKG.  
12 OZ.7 	4 SNURFRESN MEAT 

Bara-Q Sauce 
KRAFT ASST. 

18 OZ. BOTTLE'9 

IN OUR DAIRY DEPARTMENT 

• — PARKAY MARGARINE 
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Staff Photo by Janie Hartman 

A trio of buble blowers do their thing as one event of Sacred Heart's 
Junior olympics. 

Mrs. Paul Bartush named all-American 

1I■ 

Staff Photo by Janie Hartman 

Fourth graders of Sacred Heart are in a strain at tug-of-war in the 
Junior olympics. The kids are Vickie Bayer, Cindy Schilling, Jennifer 
Walter, Bernice Bartel, Cheramie Muster, Gary Hess, Helmuth 
Koelzer, Jason Frost, Gregory Hess, Scott Hennigan and Scott Wilde. 

SPORTS 

Bud Light sponsors 
and wins tournament 

411.1111°Zipir 	-4;ar  
- 417, 	 - iiIrr 

,116AU 

AVANTI 

Staff Photo by Jank Hartman 

Scott Poole of the kindergarten division boots a ball in the Olympics. 
Ellen Norwood Is his teacher. 

Please Attend... 

Muenster 
Jaycees  9 

Annual Installation 
C Awards Banquet 

Saturday, June 2, VFW Hall 
Happy Hour 0-7 p.m., 

Installation, Awards, Dinner 7-9 
Dance 9-12 p.m. 

Music by Brad Wimmer Disco 
21.50 per person 

Electrical 
Contracting 

Fixtures 
Supplies 

Residential, Commercial and 
Oil Field Wiring Installations, 

Repairs 

You Call Us—We'll Wire You 

Call 665-2721 
Nights Call 6653263 or 

665-2619 

Parker Electric 
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville 

BEST VALUE'S 
Classified ads are 

Gun Show 
National Guard Armory 

Gainesville, Texas 

May 26 and May 27 

Buy - Sell - Trade 
New - Used - Antique 

Guns - Knives • Ammo Supplies 

Sponsored by 
The North Texas Pistol League 

FREE 
Call 759-4311 

James 
Boot & Shoe 

Repair 
DYE WORK 

110 North Commerce 

Gainesville 

Open Monday thru Friday 
Saturday tit noon 	 , . vs , 
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Mrs. Paul Bartush, formerly 
Beth Smith, was named on the fir-
st Team All American in softball 
NCA Division 2. 

Beth played third base on the 

An 18 hole 2-man scramble golf 
tournament sponsored by the Lin-
dsay Booster Club is Sunday at 
the Gainesville municipal course. 
Players will assemble at 7:30 to get 
set for a shotgun start at 8 a.m. 
Mixed and ladies teams are 
welcome. 

The tournament is limited to 48 
teams in four flights, and the entry 
fee, including green fees is S40 per 

Sam Houston State baseball team 
of Huntsville. The team finished 
fourth in the country. The tour-
nament was held in Sioux Falls, 
South Dakota. 

team. Qualifying rounds are due 
at entry time. A tourney extra is a 
mulligan sale with drawing. 

Prizes in each flight for each 
player are listed as follows. First 
place, trophy and 24 balls. Second 
place, trophy and 18 balls. Third 
place, trophy and 12 balls. In ad-
dition, the longest drive earns a 
S30 gift certificate and shot 
nearest the pin earns a putter. 

Bud Light's softball team 
highlighted its own tournament 
during the weekend by earning the 
champ trophy. With a total of 52 
runs in five games, they allowed 
an average of less than three per 
games while averaging more than 
10 a game. 

The 5 day tournament, in-
terrupted by rain ended in 
Gainesville Sunday. 

They started sensationally with 
a 28-0 scoring spree over 4-1. They 
followed with wins of 9-5 over 
Gilbreath and 6-4 over Gainesville 
KC, and then were halted 3-2 in an 
all-Muenster contest with Miller 

Lite. The loss tied the tourney 
with I loss each, forcing a playoff 
for the championship. Bud Light 
won it 7-2 breaking a string of 5 
consecutive 1-run games. 

Bud Light and Gilbert Endres 
Distributing thank all who par-
ticipated and all who attended the 
tourney. Bud Light present record 
is 10-5. 

The teams in the order of their 
finish are Bud Light, Miller Lite, 
Gainesville KC, Magill's Sporting 
Goods, Gilbreath Tank Trucks, 
Strohs Light, Weber Aircraft, Fir-
st Realty, Lindsay, 4-1 Ranch, 
Bowie, and Enderby Gas. 

Lindsay Boosters sponsor tourney 

See Your 
Memorial Day 
Fun Package 

at Pat's Marine 
	

s  

Fantastic savings are yours on reliable 
Mariner Outboards. They truly are better... 

in the long run! 
ar_ .9, AMMER 
tc..._&:!OLJTBOARDS 

Staff Photo by Janie Harman 

First graders Jump rope in the junior Olympics. They are Loretta 
Reiter, Jumping and Michelle Walter. 

Staff Photo by Janie Hartman 

Amy Walterscheid has no problem clearing this item of the Olympics 
obstacle course. 

4 

BASS TRACKER HYDRA-SPORTS 

PAT'S MAninE 
East Hwy. 82 	 (817) 665.0142 

IDI 
Gainesville, Texas 	

27 
 

b.-  4  MEMORIAL 
1 .s „- 0...vs  	lia 	SPECIALS i ._. ii•i 	Effective 

DAY 

until May 29, 1984 

AT THE 

KORNER 
West Highway 82, Muenster 

:AI  759-2546 

KOUNTRY 
Open 'til 9 - 7 days a week 

COLD 
Coors or 

Coors Light 

5260  6 pack 	5 1 0 25  case 
plus tax 

BEER 
Old Milwaukee or 

Old Milwaukee Light 

T3 70 12 pack 
4, 	. 	plus tax 

Budweiser 

$5. 00 12 pack 
plus tax 

Miller Lite 

$5.40 12 pack 
plus tax 

ICE 10 LB 	50
0 a bag 

COLD 
Pepsi 	29°  12 oz. 

Coke 	 38c 16 oz 

Dr. Pepper 38c 16 oz 
plus tax 

DRINKS 
Ce and 
Coke pper 

$ al 59  8 PK 	8, tax 

Ice Cream 
Cones 5 0 C 

We have 
sandwiches 

to ao 

Staff Photo by Janie Hartman 

Jordon Bayer makes an practice run with his teacher, Beverly Martin, 
to warm up for the three legged race. 
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Photo by Jmnle tisdroso 
The graduates are: front Marilynn Hartman, Anne Felderhoff, Jeannene Voth, Carmen Sicking, Doris 
Henscheid, Lorene Bartel, Sondra Truehenbach; middle, Rita Pels, Ron Dangelmayr, Leroy Voth, Kent 
Reiter, Gus Reiter, Susan Walterscheid; Duane Haverkamp, Jim Bartush, Mark Hesse, Brad Henscheid, 
Troy Voslen, Nick Hess, Nell Hesse. 

StmffPhotobyhmlelliarhinen 
The MHS graduates of 1984 are: front, Paula Russell, Cynthia Fleeman, Deanna Bednarclk, Cindy 
Tisdale, Diana Gibson, Pam Hermes; middle, Debbie Bindel Hale, Craig Felderhoff, Bryan Hoenig, Carl 
iimmerer, Stephen Vogel, Kevin Owen, Jill Wimmer; back, Duane Walterscheld Steve Trubenbach, 
Wesley Sicking, Todd Fisher, Bryan Klement, Douglas Fleitman. 
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Thank You! 

We, at MSB, offer our deepest thanks to 

PRUE SELBY and EDGAR DYER 

for 25 years of valuable service to Muenster Public School and 
this Community. You and many others like you make Muenster a 
great place to live. 

Muenster 
State Bank 

759 -2257 	Member FDIC 

Our interest is in our community 
MUNILAvVill THE 

MirOB 

CCC summer school starts June 6 
Meredith McDaniel gets State DAR essay award 

For the many local and area 
students planning to spend at least 
a part of their summer vacation in 
the classroom, summer school at 
Cooke County College is just 
around the corner. 

Regular registration for the first 
summer session at CCC will take 
place June 4-5 (Monday and 
Tuesday) on campus, with classes 
set to begin June 6. 

According to Bill Caver, direc-
tor of counseling, regular 
registration this summer promises 
to be much lighter than usual due 
to the extensive response to a new 
system of pre-registration. 

Under the new system, students 
planning to attend summer school 
have been allowed to come to the 
CCC Counseling Center ahead of 
regular registration and sign up in 
advance for all classes. Pre- 

Paint & Body Shop 
For All Your Needs , 

1425 N. Grand 
Gainesville 

865.1112 

registration 	will continue 	up 
through the Friday (June I) 
preceding the start of regular 
enrollment. 

To take advantage of the ad-
vance registration, students 
should call for an appointment 
with a college counselor. All 
paperwork will be completed at 
that time, and students will be 
fully enrolled when they pay their 
tuition and fees. 

Caver stresses that students pre-
registering should be prepared to 
pay their tuition and Fees when 
they come to enroll. 

For regular registration, unlike 
for the longer fall and spring 

FHA officer election 
held at MHS 

New FHA officers elected on 
May 9, for the 1984-85 school year 
are: president, Jana Hamilton; 
vice president, Pat Herr; 
secretary, Laura Hess; treasurer, 
Melanie Richey; reporter, Anita 
Meurer; historian, Judy Biffle; 
parliamentarian, Kristi Pagel; 
recreation leader, Jackie Farrell. 

Bob's 
Auto Service 

• A/C. Service • Auto Transmission 
Service • Engine Overhaul • Car & Truck 
Electric Service • Chain Saw Sharpening 

R.D. Walterecheid 
7594474 or 7592713 

semesters, (here will be no time 
permits issued for summer 
enrollment. Registration will be 
conducted on a first-come, first-
served basis. 

"For returning students, getting 
into summer school couldn't be 
easier," says Dr. Don Stafford, 
CCC registrar. "All that 
previously enrolled students have 
to do is come to registration on 
Monday or Tuesday (June 4-5) 
and sign up for classes. Coun-
selors will be on duty in the 
registration area to assist students 
who need help choosing courses." 

Dr. Stafford says that students 
who have not previously attended 
CCC — whether recent high 
school graduates, college transfers 
or holders of GED certification —
should visit the Registrar's Office 
as soon as possible to pick up and 
complete an application for ad-
mission. 

In addition, the student is 
required to have a transcript from 
the last school attended or GED 
certification. 

Wimmer 
Diesel 

Service 
Truck and Tractor Repairs 

East Hwy. 82 
759.2560 

Meredith McDaniel, an 8th 
grader at Muenster Public School 
has received an award from the 
D.A.R., Texas Society of the 
National Daughters of the 
American Revolution, for par-
ticipation in the American History 
Month Essay Contest. She won 
first place for the Best Illustrated 
Essay. The award was made 
during the State Conference in 
San Antonio. Prior to entry there, 
her essay won a medal and cer-
tificate from the Francis Lightfoot 

On Dean's List 

Karla Jo Hartman, daughter of 
Leonard and Emily Hartman is 
spending the summer vacation 
here after completing her fresh-
man year at St. Mary's University 
in San Antonio, where she is 

Lee chapter of the DAR, Era, 
Texas, when Della Maberry was 
chairman. 

Meredith is an "A" student and 
is active in school and community. 
She has participated in basketball, 
track, band and prose reading in 
UIL. In community projects she 
has participated in H2O and Act-
Teens, both church-related and 
takes private dance instruction in 
jazz and tap. She is the daughter 
of Robert and Judy McDaniel. 

majoring in biology. She was on 
the Dean's Honor Roll both 
semesters and maintained a 3.5 
g.p.r. in a possible 4.0. She is a 
1983 graduate of Sacred Heart 
High School. 
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AUCTION 

JUNE 2, 1984 - 10:00 A.M. 
M.B. MARTIN 8 LOUISE BAYER FARM 

1 MILE EAST & NORTH OF MUENSTER, TX, 
205 ACRES TOTAL 

WILL BE AUCTIONED IN TWO TRACTS OF, 

TRACT A 100 ACRES 8 TRACT B 105 ACRES, THEN TOGETHER, 
THIS PRIME REAL ESTATE IS SUITABLE FOR MANY USES SUCH AS: [KELLEN, FARM LAND, GOOD PASTURE LAND, 

VERY ATTRACTIVE FOR DEVELOPMENT. INTO BUILDING SITES OR RANCHETTES, FINE LOCATION FOR HORSE RANCH 

8 GREAT FOR A DAIRY. LOCATED JUST EAST OF THE CITY LIHITU OF MUENSTER wITH GOOD HELL TRAVELED I. 

MAINTAINED GRAVEL ROAD. JUST 1 MILE NORTH OF US HWY 82 A ,M 12 MILES REST OF 1-35 IT GAINESVILLE, 1 ,  

PROPERTY MILL BE AUCTIONED AS FOLLOWS: 

TRACT "A" CONTAINS 100 ACRES AND IS FRONTED BY COUNTY ROAD. ALL OF THE MINERALS AND LEASING RIGHTS 
HILL BE INCLUDED EXCEPT FOR 10 ACRES IN THE NORTH EAST CORNER WHERE THERE IS PRESENTLY PRODUCING OIL. 
THE FORMER HOME OF THE BAYER FAMILY IS ALSO INCLUDED ALONG wiTH BARNS, CORALLS, AND TRINITY HATER 

WELL wITN SUBMERGED PUMP, LARGE POND FOR LIVESTOCK WATER AND FISHING. TERMS: AN ESCROW DEPOSIT 
HILL BE REQUIRED ON SALE DAY IN THE AMOUNT OF $10,000.00 MADE PAYABLE TO DON ELUSCHE ESCROW ACCOUNT. 

AT CLOSING OWNER WILL FINANCE AS FOLLOWS: A TOTAL OF $60,000.00 DOWN wiTH THE BALANCE Of THE PURCHASE 

PRICE WILL BE DUE IN 10 EQUAL ANNUAL INSTALLMENTS BEARING INTEREST AT 10I. 

TRACT "B" CONTAINS 105 ACRES AND IS LOCATED DIRECTLY NORTH OF TRACT 'A". No MINERALS OR LEASING RIGHTS 
RILL BE INCLUDED WITH THIS TRACT. THERE ARE PONDS FOR LIvESTOCK WATER AND FISHING, TERMS: AN ESCROW 

DEPOSIT WILL BE REQUIRED ON SALE DAY IN THE AMOUNT OF $5000.00 HYDE PAYABLE TO DON FLUSCME TRUST ACCT. 
AT CLOSING OWNER WILL FINANCE AS FOLLOWS. A TOTAL OF $15,000.00 DORN WITH THE BALANCE OF THE PURCHASE 
PRICE WILL BE DUE IN 10 EQUAL ANNUAL INSTALLMENTS BEARING INTEREST AT 10I. 

IF TRACTS 'A" L "B" ARE SOLD AS A UNIT THE OWNER WILL FINANCE AS FOLLOWS: A TOTAL OF $75,000.00 DOWN 

AT CLOSING WITH BALANCE DUE IN 10 EQUAL ANNUAL INSTALLMENTS BEARING INTEREST AT 10%. PURCHASER MAY 
PAY CASH Al CLOSING OR MAKE PREPAYMENT OF BALANCE DUE AT ANY TIME WITHOUT PENALTY. 

CLOSING WILL BE WITHIN 30 DAYS AFTER SALE DATE, WITH POSESSION AT CLOSING TIME EXCEPT FOR PRESENT 
CROPS, POSESSION OF CROP LAND RILL BE UPON COMPLETION OF GATHERING HARVEST. 

ABSTRACT OF TITLE WILL BE FURNISHED DOAN TO DATE TO BE EXAMINED BY AN ATTORNEY OF YOUR CHOICE. 

SURVEY MAY BE MADE BY PURCHASER AT PURCHASER EXPENSE AND PAY FOR NET ACRES AS FOUND IN SURVEY, 

BIDDING WILL BE ON DOLLARS PER ACRE. 	INSPECTION: DAILY, AFTERNOONS FROM 1 70 5 PM FROM MAY 29 ON. 

Farm machinery consignments will be accepted, cell 
auctioneer now to Include your machinery In this 
auction. 

CONSIGNMENTS WILL BE ACCEPTED FROM MAY 29 THROUGH MAY 31 ONLY. BRING YOUR EQUIPMENT IN 	E AFTERNOON 

WHILE AN AUCTION REPRESENTATIVE WILL BE ON THE PREMISES TO CHECK THE MACHINERY INTO THE AUCTION. 

WE EXPECT A LOT OF GOOD EQUIPMENT AND BUYERS AT THIS AUCTION. CALL III NOW TO INCLUDE YOUR EQUIPMENT. 

MR. 8 MRS. BAYER WILL SELL MANY OF THEIR HOUSEHOLD ITEMS AND ALL OF THE FARM EQUIPMENT SUCH AS: 

CHEST OF DRAWERS; DINING RR. TABLE w/cmAIRS; COUCH; SWIVEL ROCKER; WOOD ROCKING CHAIRS; DRESSERS II. 

BEDROON SUITE; OLD LAMPS; QUILT BOK, ROCKER; ETC... JOHN DEERE PLANTER 8 CULTIVATOR 2 ROW; TANDEM 

ABLE CATTLE TRAILER 12'; LISTER, 4 FARROWING PENS; JOHN DEERE MANURE SPREADER; ENSILAGE BLOWER GEHL; 

FRESNO; 3 BOTTOM PLOW 3 PT.; 1 H SIDE DELIVERY RAKE; 7' SICKLE MOWER; 4 STALLS FOR DAIRY BARN; GEAR 
HEAD FOR AIRMOTOR WINDMILL; CHICKEN COOP; SINGLE TREES; NORSE CART; BRIDLES;  4  HORSE EAVENER; HORSE 

SHOES; COLLARS; HARNESS; LOTS OF LEATHER FOR HORSES; STEEL WHEEL WAGON PARTS; SHOP TOOLS, WELDER, 

TORCH, PRESS, AIR COMPRESSOR; BOAT TRAILER; AND MANY 100'5 OF ITEMS TOO NUMEROUS TO MENTION. 

CATTLE: 4 PAIRS COW I CALF, YOUNG COWS WITH 2ND OR 3RD CALF. ALSO 3 LlmOZIN HEIFERS AND 3 BRAHMAN 

HEIFERS, 

Sale Conducted By 

Don Flusche Auction 
Member. Tex°. and Notional A■ uctioneerh AamoclaIloo 

License No. 114S 025-1757 

P.O. Box 417, 1 14 Sycamore. Muenster. Texas 76252 

817-759-2832 
26-3DI 



23 Kindergarteners graduate 

"n lMEDICAL CARE U FUNERAL 
DIRECTORS le AIR CONDITIONING 

SALES AND SERVICE Of 0=1 

.4( 
POVVERE 

835 N. Grand, 
Gainesville, Texas 

668.7241 

COSMETICS 

• Reorders 	c,,,,of 	• Facials 

Professional Beauty Consultant 
932 North Hickory, P.O. Box 189, 

Muenster TX 76252 
817-759-4541 

COSMETICS ICS 

Professional Beauty Consultant 
1027 N. Maple 

Muenster, Tx. 76252 

817759.4408 

210 N. Walnut 759-2556 	Muenster In ■ Z 

"Doing our best in serving all faiths" 

Kenneth C. Floyd 
Vice President • InveStrnen15 

Prudential.e6Che Securities, Inc 

BOO East Colitornia, Stole 9 
G•rnesvltle. Texas 76200 

Prudenhal•Bache 
Securities 

Gain•smie (air, 665.7612 
Muenster 18171759.2725 

1 

BUSINESS/SERVICE DIRECTORY 

AUTOMOTIVE 
SALES 

Endres Motor Co. 
D 	SALES and SERVICE 

Hwy 82 Muenster, (817)759 2244 
Metro 430 0292 	 r. 

LEASING 

North Texas Rent-A-Car. Inc. 
CAR and TRUCK LEASING 

"by i he day or by the month" 

Hwy 82, Muenster, (817) 759-2244 
Metro 430.0292 

ALF17.)771 

Muenster Auto Parts & Muffler Shop 
711 E Hwy 82, Muenster, 7594481 

LARRY GOBBLE 	 MIKE STURM 
Res. 759.4551 Rae. 759.2724 

"Day or Night" 	
,0,,, 

ill APPAREL 

Ch .,— Shop  
Nationally Advertised 

Brands at Reasonable Prices 
206 N Ma,n, Muenster, Texas, Pearl Evans. Owner 

=EANE2S 1  
c r E CLEANERS 

Sanitone - Certified Master Dry Cleaner 
401 N Grand, Gainesville 

P Elj=71S1 

dope item 

KNAUF ELECTRIC 
No\ 	P.O. Box 189. 932 N. Hickory, 

Muenster, Texas 16252 	(817) 759-4541 

III FOOD and 
DRINK 

111r1;771ENT71 

VW Edward D. Jones & Co. 
EStabloshed 

IAA Members New York Stock Exchange Inc SIPC 
Earl L. (Rusty) Russell III 

Bus 18171 ,59-19 42 (v7)605-0351 	 e,s1 Stare Be. 

Res M17,6607202 	 Sole 301 Geonesrdle, rx 

. JEWELERS 

Ifulinttantt . 5 1k' ut!su 
217 N. Main P.O. Box 612 
Muenster, Texas 76252 

MIKE FUHRMANN 
OWNER 	 759.2939 

IPPTS -70C7( 

Ng NURSING 1 
HOMES 

gr717/71 PRODUCT S 

111X7E711-10NES 
Muenster Telephone Corporation of Texas 

205 N Walnut, Muenster. 759-2251 

Omni Telephones & Accessories 
Competent, Professional Service 

.1,10EPENOE,,,  -The People Who Know Telephones.,•y, 

23aver' ,8 
9(olonialwaren unb %iuckerei 

Gorman baked goods and pastrIe• 

E. Hwy. 82, Muenster, (817) 759-2822 S 

H&W Meat Co. 
Custom processing of pork and beef 

HALVES and QUARTERS 

605 N. Mesquite, Muenster, 759-2744 

Sales•Servtes•Inetalletion•Gornmareiel•Restrientisl 

WILLIAMS REFRIGERATION 
HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING 

,,,NY,`" 	181716681105 	1309 N. Dixon 
•ye7C' 	Sandy Gandy Business Manager 	Gainesville 

Serving You 

tor 58 years with Sales —
Service — Rental — Leasing 

OMAC financing MIC Insura nce  
E. Her 82, Muenster. 10171 759 2251 

Call toll free from Gainesville 1817935 2209 

WILDE 

re 52 

tichmidlkoler Automotive Inc. 
BIG 	Auto Parts 

*at 

• Reorders 	 • Facials 

Jan am 

Red River 
Cut Rate Liquor 

"Wide variety of fine Liquors — vintage domestic and 

Imported Wines" 

PARTY CATERING AVAILABLE 
E. Hwy. 82. Muenster. 7594131 

McCoy-Miller 
Funeral Home 

4:1rN 249i and) 
4.; 	Zreebere anb Zeuelopero 

Of ifine Yegintereb 
57ereforb anb Commercial d 	,,b4u 
*reforbCroge !Settle 	tit I 601 h ,,,2 

HWY 81 
MUENSTER, Jr 

eta 
CallColt Cr 	 211.B. E. Hwy. 82 

18E71825 3184 	 Nocon•, Testis 

SUPERIOR 
HOME CARE MEDICAL, INC. 
Hospital and Respiratory Therapy Equipment 

LINDA EDGETT 
Administrator 

(817) 685.5221 
OAK TREE LODGE 

P.O. Box 1199 	GAINESVILLE 

Luting with Dignify - Aging wall Undersrandlna Caring with Pride 

WALTERSCHEID OIL CO. 
Bulk & Consumer Saes 

Wholesale & Retail 

Petroleum Products/Gas 8 Oil Distributor 
(817)759-2737, Muenster 	Kerr-McGee 

Interior 8 Exterior Painting 
Tape 8 Bed, Wallpaper. 

Texture, Concrete Work, and Remodeling 

665-4777 

County 4-H'ers have fashion show 
The Cooke County 4-H Fashion 

Show was held May 19 at Whaley 
United Methodist Church in 
Gainesville, sponsored by First 
State Bank. Theme of the show 
was "Spring Into Summer." 

Fifty entries were made by 
Cooke County 4-H members. 
Among them were the following 
from Muenster: Dana 
Dankesreiter blue ribbon and first 
in non-tailored day wear; Amy 
Davidson, blue ribbon in the same 
category. Both are senior 4-H 
members. 

In the junior 4-H division were 
Amy Dankesreiter blue ribbon; 

Children's theatre 
summer workshop 
gets CCC encore 

Cooke County College will raise 
the curtain for an encore of its 
popular summertime Children's 
Theater Workshop in early June. 

Registration will be conducted 
May 28 through June I in the 
CCC Division of Continuing 
Education office on campus. 
Classes will meet Monday through 
Thursday evenings, 6 to 7:30 p.m. 
beginning June 18 (no class on In-
dependence Day). 

Set to run for six weeks, the 
workshop is being conducted in 
association with the Butterfield 
Stage Playhouse Community 
Theater and will include instruc-
tion in acting, stage movement, 
stagecraft, makeup, costuming' 
and other areas such as im-
provisation and mime. 

According to instructor Lynette 
Kirk, classes will run through July 
27, and the workshop program 
will culminate with the production 
of a play, set for two performan-
ces on July 26-27, in which all par-
ticipants are guaranteed a part. 

As yet, no decision has been 
made regarding the specific play 
to be done, but Ms. Kirk says it 
will be a show similar in structure 
to last summer's popular "Peter 
Pan." Final selection of a play 
will depend upon the number and 
age distribution of youngsters who 
will be participating. 

Dr. Eddie Hadlock, dean of 
Continuing Education at CCC, 
reports that the workshop is open 
to youngsters ages six through 16. 
Parents are asked to register their 
children in person so that an in-
formation sheet can be filled out. 
The sheet will contain the par-
ticipants' ages, measurements for 
costumes, previous experience and 
other information. 

Dawn Knabe white; Amber Vogel 
white; Marcia Vogel red; Amy 
Bayer blue; Vickie Bayer red; 

Among senior winners from 
Lindsay were Lucy Fuhrmann, 
first in active sportswear and blue 
ribbon; Kelly King blue; Doris 
Voth, evening and specialty wear, 
blue; Junior 4-H winners Emily 
Corcoran red; Deidra De Borde 
blue; Cassandra Fuhrmann first 
place and blue ribbon; Kim 
Hoberer blue; Bethany Krebs 
blue; Amy Sandmann blue; inter- 

mediate junior: Julie Fuhrmann 
white; Calista McGilvray blue. 

Senior Era winners, in non 
tailored day wear were Karen 
Knight blue; Kelly Yarbrough, 
tailored, blue. Junior winners 
were Clint Alphin blue; Gayle 
Lange red; intermediates, Paige 
Lange first place and blue; Karen 
Pope red; new category Clint 
Alphin, Dillon Enderby, Camelia 
Garcia red, Dalia Garcia red, 
Melissa Knabe blue, Gayle Lange 
blue, Misty Matthews blue, Jodie 
Rehm, Shirley Reiter, Clint Worth 
blue, and Tobie Vice. 

Senior Callisburg non-tailored 

day wear: Kellie Cannon red, 
Deanna Westbrook blue; inter-
mediates Kelly King. 

Valley View juniors: Christi 
Aubert red, Jackie Garner blue, 
Jamie Mathis red, Kristen 
McKown blue; intermediates 
Tracey Doughty red, Lindsay 
Stahl blue. 

Senior Mountain Springs win-
ners: Amy Pitzinger, non-tailored 
red; junior Bethany Clark red; in-
termediates Angela Clark. 

Gainesville intermediate Janie 
Schumacher red, Debbie Thomas 
blue. 

Activities during the day in-
cluded judging refreshments, 
modeling session and fashion 
show. 

Judges were Mrs. Robert Bayer, 
Sharon Felderhoff, Phyllis Aston, 
Carla Bullard, Betty Hassell and 
Linda Sandmann. 

In charge of decorations and 
theme were Vicki Clark and Loret-
ta De Borde. Kelly Yarbrough 
gave modeling tips. Dana 
Dankesreiter, Deana Nortman 
and Doris Voth were commen-
tators for the fashion show. 

The parent-sponsored Kin-
dergarten graduation celebration 
for 23 little ones was held in the 
Public School Auditorium on May 
15 at 7:30 p.m. 

Linda Knabe gave the in-
vocation, followed by songs by the 
Kindergartners: "Oh, How I Love 
Jesus", "This Land is Your 
Land" and "Friends". Denise 
Bayer and Christi Klement ac-
companied on guitars. 

Sister Romana Rohmer was 
speaker for the program. "Que 
Sera, Sera" was a duet presented 
by Mmes. Linda Flusche and 
Christi Klement, with guitar ac-
companiment. 

Presentation of diplomas was 
held by Mmes. Mildred Biffle, 
Christi Klement, room mothers, 
and Florence Williams, the Kin-
dergarten teacher. Jean Pagel 

Homemaking classes 
begin May 22 

Summer Homemaking classes at 
Muenster Public School begin 
May 22 and end June 15. The 
classes are open to any High 
School student, whether or not 
they have been previously enrolled 
in homemaking. 

Classes will be taught in these 
areas; foods, with emphasis on 
nutritious snacks, outdoor 
cookery and microwave cookery, 
home decorating and clothing 
construction. 

A class for adults on fabric 
frames will be on Thursday, June 
14 at 7:30 p.m. Anyone interested 
in being a part of the summer 
homemaking program may con-
tact Mrs. Joni Sturm at 759-2281 
or 759-2724. Morning classes are 
from 9:00 to 12:00 and afternoons 
1:00 to 3:30.  

played 	the piano for the 
recessional. 

The morning Kindergarten class 
includes: Melissa Sue Biffle, Da 
Lana Nicole Endres, Jeffrey 
Wayne Felderhoff, Julia Cecilia 
Fleitman, Jeff Patrick Flusche, 
Jeremy Lee Hellinger, Misty Lea 
Klement, Stephen James Klement, 
Phillip Gregory Russell, Cody 
Wayne Sicking and Jason Ray 
Sicking. 

The afternoon Kindergarten 

Woodshop students 

	

Twelfth grade 	Woodshop 
students of Muenster High School 
saw three areas of special interest 
during a field trip on May 8. 

They had the opportunity to see 
the Sanders Mfg. Company in 
Gainesville, at their first stop. 
This company builds church fur-
niture. Of particular interest was 
the construction of wood veneer 
furniture. 

Next stop was at Paxton Lum-
ber Co. in Fort Worth. The 
students saw a wide variety of 
domestic and imported lumber 
and plywood. They also toured 
the millshop which produces fancy 
moulding and trim. 

They made their third stop at 
Peterbilt Truck Factory in Den-
ton, and saw there an assembly 
line operation of truck building 
from start to finish which 
produces 13 trucks a day. Most 
impressive was the clean,  

class includes: Summer Cerelle 
Bass, John Aaron Fanning, Carrie 
Elaine Hess, Andrea Lee Klement, 
Audrey Marie Knabe, Mary 
Catherine Knabe, Wendy Allison 
Pels, Martha Jo Riggs, Darrell 
Lee Russell, Tina Renee Schmitz, 
Toni LYnn Trubenbach and 
Joseph Mark Walterscheid. 

Michelle Dawn Trachta was a 
member of the morning class until 
she moved with her family to 
Plano, Tx. 

see three plants 
organized plant operation. The 
students were abe to sit behind the 
wheel of a completed truck. 

Transportation on the field trip 
was furnished by Albert Zim-
merer. 

Fourth graders 
take field trip 

Fourth graders of Muenster 
Elementary and their teacher, 
Barbara Robison visited three 
places on a field trip May 8. 

Their first stop was Weber Air-
craft where they saw seats and kit-
chen equipment being manufac-
tured for an assortment of planes. 

Next they went to Cooke Coun-
ty College for a science lecture by 
Bill Stanley on poisonous and 
non-poisonous. The class was 
fascinated by it. 

The last stop was the Cooke 
County zoo to see the assortment 
of animals and finish the field trip 
with lunch and recreation. The 
students were accompanied by 
Jean Park, head room mother, 
plus Alice Walterscheid, Margie 
Wimmer, Lynn Hacker, Sherrie 
Poulsen, Leanne Ladd and the bus 
driver, Pat Walterscheid. 

Dana Dankesreiter, Muenster senior 4-H member and her sister Amy, 
Junior 4-H member, daughters of Tom and Rosemary Dankesreiter 
are shown with the ribbons they won at the Cooke County 4-H 
Fashion Show on May 19 at Whaley United Methodist Church in 
Gainesville. Dana won first place in her division of non-tailored day 
wear, therefore will advance to district competition in July in Dallas. 
This is her third year to compete at the district level. Amy also won a 
blue ribbon for her Jumper. 

For our next 
SHOPPER 

Call 759-4311 
54 



Lindsay High graduates line up for the procession to their commen-
cement ceremony. 
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Sale Continues 
10-20-30-40-50% off 

1-Clun Cabinet 
(100un) 

Reg. $309.95 

Sale *206" 
Frultwood Finish 

Curio Cabinet 
Reg. $249.95 

Sale 66" 

1.Oun Cabinet 
(e Gun) 

Reg. $249.95 

Sale s1 669i 
Battery operated 

Clocks 
Reg. $38.95 

Sale $19" 
All Mirrors 1/2 price 

"n/Kete Beauttfut 41:.191 

90.71 "  

Gainesville 	665-6762 
103 W. Broadway, 2 blocks North of Courthouse 

Mary Scoggin - Manager 27.101 

New GMC'S 
Pickups & Trucks 

See us for expert 
Tune-ups and Air Conditioning Service 

HOEDEBECK GMC 
216 N. Main, Muenster, 759.4336 

"0, 

	  1111■11111111 

Do you have an investment that can 

Double in 6 years 
'friple in years 

Quadruple in 11 years 
Zero Coupon Bonds from Prudential-Bache Securities can. How? 

Zeros are purchased for a fraction of their face value. And instead of 
paying interest periodically, the interest is automatically reinvested and 
compounded over the life of the bond. The effects of this compounding 
are quite dramatic. For example, a $350 initial investment would grow to 
$1,000 in as little as 91/2 years. 

Zeros are especially attractive for retirement planning and 
funding your children's education. To learn more call Kenneth 
Floyd at 817-759-2725 or 817-665 -7612 or stop by our office at 
800 E. California, Suite 9. 

Bring us your future. 

Prudential-Bache 
800 E CAlliornia, Suite 9, Geinesme, To 76240 

01g

▪  

81

▪ 

 v

▪  

ma

▪  

en

▪  

.

▪ 

 B

▪  

ac. a011.05 Merndir SIPC 

Securities 

Missy 
Sults 

I Flack 
(Most' 

Men's 

Men's 
1 Tabli 
fied4 

We 
suns 

Or 

Diplomas awarded to 
31 Lindsay graduates 

The 1983-84 school year of Lin-
dsay High School came to a close 
Friday evening at 8 p.m. in the 
Lindsay Cafetorium. 

Baccalaureate services were held 
Sunday evening May 13 for the 31 
graduating seniors. 

Speakers at the ceremony in-
cluded Glenn Hermes, Valedic-
torian and Aaron Hoenig 
Salutatorian. The guest speaker 
for the evening was Senator Ray 
Farabee. 

Award winners were introduced 
by the School Principal Henry 
Schroeder and presented by 
School Superintendent Glenn 
Hellman. 

Students receiving diplomas 
were introduced by Hellman and 
presented by School Board 
President Frank Sandmann. 

The invocation and benediction 
were given by Father Cletus and 
processional and recessional 
music was played by Shawna 
Hellman. 

Students receiving awards for 
outstanding classwork included: 

Cheryl Dennison, physical scien-
ce; Christy Hellman, biology; 
Glenn Hermes, advanced biology; 
Collette Hoenig, chemistry; 
Aaron Hoenig, advanced physics; 
Victor Schmidlkofer, physics; 
Wayne Fleitman, English II; Vic-
tor Schmidlkofer, English III; 
Glenn Hermes, English IV; Linus 
Fuhrmann, outstanding student; 
Beverly Neu, Spanish I; Beverly 
Hermes, Spanish II; Shawn 
Hoenig algebra I; Collette 
Hoenig, algebra II; Christy 
Hellman, geometry; Glenn Her-
mes, computer math I; Aaron 
Hoenig, computer math II; Victor 
Schmidlkofer, drafting; Donna 
Lutkenhaus ag. I; John San-
dmann, ag. II; John Sprouse, ag-
mechanics; Beverly Neu, home ec. 
II; Gina Hellman, family living; 
Nancy Neu, advanced home ec; 
Laura Fuhrmann, typing; Colette 
Hoenig, accounting; Victor Sch-
midlkofer, world studies; Beverly 
Hermes. civics; Beverly Neu. 
advanced social studies and Sheila 
Haverkamp DAR award. 

Lindsay 	 
News 

  

 

by Patty Eberhart 

The year ends for 
Lindsay YHT 

The 	Lindsay 	Young 
Homemakers met on May 15 at 
Claudia Zimmerer's home for 
their final meeting of the year. 
Senior girls and girls who entered 
the essay contest attended. 

All members brought a Mexican 
dish for the meal. 

Deana Nortman won the essay 
contest "How FHA will help me 
in the future". She is the outstan-
ding future young homemaker of 
Lindsay. 

Claudia Zimmerer was voted 

outstanding young homemaker. 
Officers for the 1984-85 year are 

Carol Luttmer, president; Becky 
Bezner, vice president; Peggy 
Kasparek, secretary-treasurer and 
reporter. 

The new officers will be in-
stalled at the August 21 meeting. 
Also, Secret Pals will be revealed 
and names will be drawn for new 
ones. The meeting will be at Becky 
Bezner's home. Anyone wishing 
to join is invited to come. 

Parties honor Nancy Zimmerer 
Bobby Dobbs was the honoree at 
a bridal luncheon hosted by Mrs. 

Nancy Zimmerer, bride-elect of law; Marie Zimmerer bride's 

godmother; and Rhonda Headrick 

Donna Zimmerer bride's sister-in-

and Lisa Hess. Thecla Gossett in her home on 	
On Tuesday, May 8, Margie Saturday, May 5. The hostess Riley was hostess for a 

presented a red and white corsage miscellaneous shower held in the 
as the honoree arrived. 	

Fellowship Hall of Grand Avenue 
Baptist Church. The honoree was 

Guests were Marcella Zimmerer presented a red and white corsage and Helen Dobbs, mothers of the by the hostess. 
couple; Cecilia Hermes bride's 	

Approximately 20 guests atten- 
grandmother; Diane Luttmer ded and were served pick-up maid of honor; Janet Bayer and foods, punch, nuts and mints. 
Laura Headrick bridesmaids; 

Seminarians of India send 
thanks to Lindsay benefactors 

The Secular Franciscans of St. holy priesthood and studying in 
Peter's Fraternity, Lindsay held the different seminaries, etc. He 
their monthly meeting on Tuesday said in June they will be recruiting 
in the afternoon of May 15. In the boys for the seminary. 
St. Peter's Parish hall, the meeting 	On May 14, 1984, the first 
included the opening prayer from payment was mailed to Bishop 
the Franciscan Ritual. 	 Peter for the first four years of 

Mrs. Tony Hermes led the the seminarian's studies. the 
prayers and presided at the president read the letter of respon-
meeting. Minutes and financial se to the Bishop, there-by giving 
report were given and approved. 	all the members the knowledge of 

Mrs. Veronica Klement read procedures being taken. 
from Scripture I Corinthian Chap- 	The last issue of New Vision 
ter 1 verses 22-31 "Preaching the Course Issue No. 10 connections 
crucified Christ is the power of was read by Mrs. Tony Hermes. 
God." 	 This brought to the close the New 

The president read a letter from Vision Course. 
Bishop Peter Chanaparampil in 	A copy of The Secular Fran- 
Alleppey, Kerala, South India. He ciscan News from Linda Stone of 
expressed his deep appreciation Norman, Okla. was given to each 
and his happiness that all the member present. 
members, are in favor of suppor- 	The up-coming garage sale was 
tins a Seminarian during the tour- discussed. Plans were made to 
se of his studies. He asked the prepare items and articles for the 
president to convey his heart-felt sale. Meeting adjourned with the 
thanks to the Franciscan Frater- closing prayer from the Ritual, 
nity members. Petitions and St. Francis Prayer. 

In his letter, the Bishop ex- Mrs. Tony Hermes served pun-
plained the procedures and time ch, cake and cookies for refresh-
for a boy to reach his goal, the ments after the meeting. 

Florida kin visit Sandmanns 
Recent guests at the home of Caul, Sister Ferdinand, her 

Donny and Linda Sandmann were teacher, Frank and Lorrine San-
Linda's parents Mr. and Mrs. dman and their children, Robbie 
Henry McCaul of Florida. They and Amy, an aunt and uncle Bar-
made the trip especially for their bara and Jimmy Schon and their 
grandaughter, Stephanie San- children; Mrs. Frank Sandmann 
dmann's First Communion. Sr., Stephanie's grandmother and 

A small family gathering in the her sister Megan. 
home of Donny and Lihda an- 	Mr. and Mrs. McCaul were also 
dmann was also held in honor of able to attend May Crowning in 
Stephanie. Guests included her which Stephanie took part. 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Mc- 	After a stay of two weeks they 

returned home to Florida. 

New arrival 
Tony and Theresa Hermes are 

happy to announce the arrival of 
DeAnn infant daughter of Riley 
and JoAnn Beaty, making them 
great-grandparents for the first 
time. 

She was born at Wilson and 
Jones Hospital in Sherman at 
about 1:40 p.m. Monday, May 21, 
1984 weighing 8 lbs and 11/2 oz. 
Her mother is the former JoAnn 
Hermes. Cecil and Doris Hermes 
are grandparents for the first time. 

Personal 
Carol Luttmer was recently a 

patient at the Muenster hospital. 
She underwent a tonsilectomy and 
is now recuperating at home. 

Comfort. Live It Everyday. 

These naturally flexible and cushiony comfortable shoes are 

designed to support you through the day. Our Breathin' Brushed 

Pigskin"' leather has heed specially treated so its easy to clean. A 

built-in mud guard let's you laugh at the rain. So go ahead and slip 

your foot into a shoe that's made for walking 

Hush Puppies 
Comfort is our ch lc  

Key West 

' 
	$3300 

/ 

"The Place To Go For Brands You Know" 

HAM RIC'S 111. 	Mans and Boys Wear 
Muenster 

WMI AVERAGE BILLING, 
YOUR ELECTRIC BILL 
WILL BE ABOUT ME 
SAME EACH MONTH. 

For Checking Accounts, 
You Can Believe In 

Olney Savings. 

The Olney Savings/Checking Account 
The Olney Savings/Check Club 

The Olney Savings/Super Checking Account 
Commercial Checking 

Everyone knows electric 
bills go up and down throughout 
the year Some months they're 
low. Some months they're 
higher, depending on how much 
electricity you use. 

But for most of us there 
aren't any highs and lows in our 
monthly income. It's pretty 
much the same from month to 
month. So, balancing the 
monthly budget can be a 
problem. 

Well, Texas Power and Light 
Company has an answer. Its  

the Average Billing Plan. And 
each month after you join, you'll 
pay an average of your monthly 
electric bills over the past twelve 
months. No more ups and 
downs. 

Of course, you're still pay-
ing for all the electricity you use. 
But with average billing, your 
electric bills will be about the 
same each month. So budgeting 
will be that much easier. 

If you want to know more 
about our Average Billing Plan, 
call your local TP&L office today. 

OLNEY 
SAVINGS 

For details, come see us soon, or call and well come see you. 

Member FSLIC 

Olney. Seymour. Jactaboro. Bridgeport, N000na. Wealherlord, sae. Graham, Archer City. WIchila 
Br...wood, Bowie, Vernon, Der.atur, Boyd, Throcernodon, Albany. Anson, Coleman. Clam, Holliday. Crowell 
sod Oeineavele *Me. Ranger Savings in Runge, Eastland Sayings In Eastland, and Elect.. Sevings In Electra. 

All Divisions of Olney Savings 
TEXAS POWER & LIGHT COMPANY 

26401 



Muenster 
Pharmacy 

Medical Center Building 

017-759.2033 „ ■ , 

Goff's 
Bargain Corner 

Saint Jo, Texas 

Memorial Weekend Sale 
Friday and Saturday, May 25-26 

Missy and Ladles Bathing 
Sults 	  20% off 
1 Rack Men's Shirts, 
(Mostly large sizes) 	 25% off 
Men's Shoes 	  50% off 
Men's Slacks 	 25% off 
1 Table Drapes and 
Bedspreads 	  50% off 

We have new ladies 
sunshades, children's 

clothes, boys 
Dickie overalls. 

We will be closed, 

Monday, May 28, 
in observance of 

Memorial Day  
9 a.m. 5 p.m. Mon. thru Sat. 2' i 

Preservation 	********* 
care 
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Special drawing for MYSTERY GIFT!! 

LIVE AUCTION 	SILENT AUCTION  
Services Weekend at Stockyards Hotel 

and Billy Bob's 
Gourmet dinners for 6 Dr 8 
Permanent by Charlotte 

Week end at luxury Dallas howl 
Tennis lessons 
Racquetball membership 8 lessons 
Legal serwces Idi a will 

Items 
Santa Genrudis Bull 	Antique Armoire 	Painting Of Windmill By Lewis Caner 

Antique Stained Glass 	Howland Vase 	Walnut headboard With Brass Trim 

Tom Landry Signature 	Navajo Bracelet 	Antique Shotgun 

on Cowboys pennant 	Ivory Necklace 	Underwood Typewriter, c 1920 

Rawlings Football 	Poster By Stu Moskowitz Antique Bell Pull 

UT Commemorative Plate 

Auctioneer 

10 LB Hershey Chocolate Bar 	Litton Cookware 	* 
Antique lean Plate 	 Antique Shotgun 	

S Silk Flower Arrangement 	Andiron Set 
Drehing Table 	 Big Mac Coupons 	* 
Antique Women's Hats and Shoes. Antique Meet Grinder * 
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And many more Inteetaetng Herne! 

COME ALONG, HAVE FUN, AND OUT-BID YOUR BEST FRIEND!! 

Tickets Available at Morton Museum 

Proceeds from this auction are in support of a National Endowment for the Humanities Challenge 
Grant to the Cooke County Heritage Society/Morton Museum, funds horn it are to be expended 

for the improvement of Morton Museum 
SALE BY 

MIKE JONES 

Forestburg 
News 

goulueb & 

1" 1"' ," 
Balloon Greetings & 

Fruit Baskets 

314 fl 11./atetut 

Mietuttr, 

817-759-4951 9.5 Mon. Fr 9.12 Sat 

OFF , 	IS 

Edwin Alexander 

Chairmen of the Board 

Tim Bullard 

President 

Rey Nichol. 

Executive Vice President 

and Cashier 

Ornie F. Bhorrill 
Sr Vice President 

and Sr Trust Off Icor 

Von IMIBM, Jr. 
SI Vice President 

and Lending 011icer 

Mery Ellen Gibbs 
Vice President 

and Auditor 

Robert Soon* 
Vice President 

Demlyn Neidhardt 
Trust Of ricer 

Lloyd Reiter 
Assistant Vice President 

and Controller 

Clam Na. lieu 
Beni. Wi TRIM 

Aselet•nt Vice Presidents 

Bandy Jacdon 

Executive Secrete, 

William P. Nine 

Malone Dubois 

Mgr, Jun Lewis 

Mildred Dade 

Shirley aurae 
Mine Cook 

Assistant cashiers 

Mary ridded 

Aselslanl Trust Officer 

RESOURCES 

Loans and Discounts 	  S 68,420,231.76 

U.S. Government Securities 	 3  527,728.71 

U.S. Government Agency 	 1  099,554.49 
Municipal Securities 	 6  979,320.37 

Federal Funds Sold 	 6  000.000.00 

Federal Reserve Bank Stock 	  105,100.00 

Cash and Due From Banks 	  8  554,932.31 

Banking House 	  2  576,545.74 

Furniture and Fixtures 	 263,980.96 

Other Real Estate 	 445,728.31 

Ocher Assets 	  4  347,648.88 
SI 02,320,771.53 

LIABILITIES 

Capital Stock 	  S 1,716,330.00 

Surplus 	 2  000,000.00 

Capital Debentures 	  100.000.00 

Mortgage Indebtedness 	 270,000.00 

Undivided Prof its and Reserves 	2  701.827.94 

Other Liabilities 	  472.377.92 

Deposits 	 95,060,235.67  

5102.320,77!.53 

Edwin Memnder 
Chairman of the Board 

Tim Sullen, 

President 

Elbrldpe Campbell 
Rancher 

Jae. 5. Canon 
President. B.J.Co.. 

Contractors, Inc 

President' Cameo Steel 
Worlm.Inc 

Robert L Claxton, Jr. 

Owner.PresIdient:Cluton 

Button, Inc. 

Partner Decorators Alley 

Partner. Glutton It Burkhut 

Robed A. Dads, Jr. 

Director minnioen General 

Corporation 

Consultent. Southiend 
Palm Company 

Belle F. IMMO 

Sr Vice Preeident 
and Sr Trust Off ICer 

Ceell Word 
President. Gainesville 

Livestock Market, Inc. 

Chorles M. Moon 
Partner A PI.IIId•rlt 

Inc 

RmP. Wilson 
investments 

G 
NB 

GAINESVILLE NATIONAL BANK 

GAINESVILLE, TEXAS 

MEMBER f .0.1.G. 
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Forestburg man on "Crime Stoppers" Forestburg school gets 
high TABS scores Kim (Ankerson) Desmuke's 

husband Tony was on Crime-
Stoppers program on channel 5 on 
the 5 p.m. news Mon. May 21. He 
was the victim in the re-inactment 
of the crime. We will have some 

• more interesting information for 
you in the near future about Kim's 
husband and son. 

--- 
We are sorry there was no news 

for you to ponder over in the last 
week's Muenster Enterprise. Shall 
endeavor to bring you up to date 
in this column, 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Jay Houston of 

Sunset are the proud parents of a 
baby girl born Monday May 7 in 
the Gainesville hospital. The 
young miss has been named Jay-
me Kristina. Maternal gran-
dparents are Mr. and Mrs. Gor-
don Wade of Forestburg and Mrs. 
Ellen Pittman of Sunset. Paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Gunter of Jacksboro. Great-
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Strauss Wade and Mrs. L.D. 
Flower of Sunset, Mr. and Mrs. 
G.W. Couger of Possum 
Kingdom and Mrs. Hazel 
Houston of Breckenridge. 

--- 
Ted Jackson, S.T. Warford and 

Jack Dempsey went a-fishing at 

Lake Dallas on Monday, May 7. 
Ted reports the catch was fair. 
Then on Wed., May 9 Ted and 
S.T. took Ted's grandson Larry 
Dill fishing at Lake Texoma. They 
spent the nite but the wind got up 
so high they had to give up fishing 
with only a small catch to their 
credit. 

--- 
This writer met up with J.C. 

Volkman over in Muenster on Fri. 
May 11. J.C. is doing fine and 
resides in Burleson. 

- — 
Mrs. Lois Parsons passed away 

Fri. May 11 in Dallas and 
graveside services were conducted 
at the Perryman Cemetery Mon. 
p.m. May 14. Lois was a sister to 
the late Audra Coleman and Roxie 
Dunn. 

- -- 
Vera Mae McGee had a very 

wonderful Mother's Day over in 
Bowie at her daughter, Mrs. Edna 
Merle Hill's home. All seven of 
Vera Mae's children were present. 
Present were Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Griffin and Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Wilkerson of Wichita Falls; Mayo 
McGee of Amarillo; Jan McGee 
of Fort Worth; Mr. and Mrs. Dale 
McGee of Kemp, Mr. and Mrs. 
Chris McGee of Midway and of 
course - Mrs. Edna Merle Hill of 

Bowie and a niece of Vera Mae's, 
Mrs. Wanda Perryman of Forest-
burg. 

--- 
Enjoying homemade ice cream, 

fresh strawberries and cake with 
Ted and Laura Belle Jackson Sun 
p.m. May 13 were Mr. and Mrs. 
S.T. Warford of Slidell and Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Dill and family. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Hollenstein and 

daughter Ellen of Azle visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. W.T. Reynolds on 
Sat. May 12. They all motored 
over to Bowie to eat lunch at 
Morrows'. 

- -- 
One p.m. recently Larry Bailey 

called to say some goats had 
shown up at his place and he got 
them in a lot. His mother, Junita, 
played nurse-maid to the critters 
until their owner was located. This 
turned out to be Billy Biffle. 
Juanita says she sorta enjoyed the 
goats while they were her guests. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Elvin Echols of 

Watauga were recent visitors with 
his parents Mr. and Mrs. D.D. 
Echols of Mallard. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Hunt of 

Paulsboro, New Jersey have 
moved back to Texas, to Fort 

Worth. 
- -- 

Willis Kelly of Louisiana and 
Keith Kelly of Nappa, California 
were recent visitors with their 
aunt, Mrs. Louise Shults. Willie 
and Keith are brothers. 

--- 
Mrs. Paula Barker and Angie of 

Wichita Falls made the Forestburg 
scene Fri., May 18 to attend the 
graduation excercises of the 
Senior Class of 1983 of which 
Paula's niece Mashelle Hudspeth 
was a member. After the 
graduation excercises Mashelle 
was honored with a reception in 
the home of her grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Hudspeth 
with only family members present. 

--- 
011ie Tipton and Eugene and 

Jeannie Tipton of Sanger and Mr. 
and Mrs. Rick Vannoy and Kim of 
Denton spent the May 12-13 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. G.D. 
Wylie, Jr. On Saturday May 12 
Mrs. Bobbie Wylie attended the 
wedding of her nephew Kenneth 
Tipton to Terry Cudd in Denton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenne Woods of 
Henrietta spent Friday nite May 
18 with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Woods of Stoney Point. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Jackson of 

Decatur and Mr. and Mrs. Randy 
Bird of Paradise had supper with 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Jackson Mon. 
p.m. May 14. It was a delayed 
Mother's Day visit and get-
together. 

--- 
Mrs. Eula Faye (Landers) Cor-

dell of Lawton, Okla. and Mrs. 
Margaritte (Landers) Wright of 
Wichita Falls spent Tues. May 15 
with Barney and Veda Brogdon. 

--- 
Marion and Howard Sockwell 

had a big Mother's Day outing in 
Arzyle with their daughter and 
family Mr. and Mrs. Bill Kenas 
and Trey, Mr. and Mrs. Howard 
K. Garrison, Crystal and Heather 
and Mr. and Mrs. Keith Rogers 
and Tiffany. The group enjoyed a 
back-yard bar-b-q with all the 
trimmings. 

The 	Forestburg 	United 
Methodist women met at 2 p.m. 
Wed. May 16 in the church annex. 
The program for the day was 
"The Power of God in Our Mid-
st" led by Mrs. Esther Shears who 
also furnished refreshements for 
the fellowship time after the 
program. Present were Mmes. 
Lucille Littell, Esther Shears, Bet-
ty Reynolds, Cleo Lanier, Laura 
Belle Jackson and Vera Mae 
McGee. 

- -- 
Mrs. Betty Scott underwent 

surgery the first part of last week 
in a Dallas hospital and returned 
home the last part of the week. 
Betty is doing very well. We wish 
her a very speedy recovery. 

- -- 
Glen Lynch was admitted to the 

Bowie Hospital Sat. May 19 and 
hopes to be home in a few days. 

- -- 
It was dance recital time Sat. 

night May 19 in Bowie at the 
Junior High school auditorium. 
Taking part in the tap and ballet 
part were the daughters of Larry 
and Mary Jo Eldridge, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Dill and the gran-
daughters of Elmo and Imogene 
Brewer. Others attending besides 
those mentioned above were Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack C. Dill, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.W. White, Mrs. Nora Gar-
trell, Mrs. Rosemary Reynolds, 
mrs. June Eldridge and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ernest Moore and daughters. 

- -- 
Mrs. Evelyn Brown of Leo 

visited with Mrs. Emma Steadham 
on Sat. May 19. Emma's visitor 
on Mon. afternoon May 21 was 
Latricia Bell. 

- -- 
Donal Steadham has sold the 

Lizzie Gardner home to a doctor 
and his wife and three children 
from Fort Worth. The new 
Forestburg residents have been 
moving in all of last week. At the 
present we don't have their name. 

- -- 
Mrs. Peggy Holland and Brent 

motored to Denton Saturday May 
19 to spend the day shopping and 
were joined by Mrs. Christy 
Rashid for lunch and they all took 
in a movie. 

--- 
Rex and Billie Anderson made it 

to Euless Sat. the 19th to visit with 
Mrs. Susan Hatcher and 
daughters. Then on to Lake Dallas 
where they visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. Tony Desmuke and Ian. 

- -- 
Mrs. Oma Wakeman, Mrs. 

Louise Shults, Mrs. Ola Mae 
Shults and Dale attended the 
memorial services at Rush Creek 
Sat. May 19. Oma and Louise 
took their dinner which they 
spread at the home of Charlie and 
Artie Weber. 

Scores of Forestburg students in 
the 1984 Texas Assessment of 
Basic Skills (TABS), which was 
administered in February have 
been reported to the school 
district. Aggregate scores are 
reported to the public whereas in-
dividual scores are reported to 
students parents and school per-
sonnel. 

Third, fifth and ninth grade 
students participated in the sub-
jects of reading, writing and math. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Colwell and 
children of Lewisville spent the 
May 18-20 weekend with her 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Willard 
Freeman. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Truman Green-

wood of Pilot Point visited with 
Mrs. Georgia Greenwood, 
Wynona and JoAnn on Sun. May 
20. 

- -- 
Ted Jackson and Mr. and Mrs. 

S.T. Wardord treated Laura Belle 
Jackson to a day out in Denton in 
honor of her up-coming birthday. 
The treat included dinner (supper) 
at Wyatt's Cafeteria, after a 
period of shopping and fun. All 
this took place Sat. May 19. 

- -- 
Mrs. Cloud Barclay of Alvord 

was honored with a birthday party 
Sun. afternoon May 20. She is 89 
years young and most of her 
children were present to help her 
celebrate. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Mitchell and 

his sister Coralee of Fort Worth 
visited with Millie and Wib 
Reynolds Sun. p.m. May 20. 

- -- 
It was also happy birthday time 

for Clifford Hudspeth Sun. May 
20. Helping him celebrate were 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Hudspeth and 
family; Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Lun-
ch, Rayann Lynch of Denton; 
Lecia Lynch of Arlington; Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Wood, son 
Kip and a grandson Blayne James 
of Wichita Falls, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Dawson Ensey of the Burg. 

- -- 
Another birthday party took 

place at the New Harp community 
Sun May 20 honoring Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Hunt. Joe's birthday is 
June 5 and Dorothy's was May 20. 
The Hunt's children Honored 
them with the celebration. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack C. Dill 

motored to Denton Sun. p.m. the 
20th to visit with their daughter 
Vatoni. 

Emma Steadham reports that 

Standards for minimally accep-
table written composition were 
raised. Standards for math and 
reading will be raised in coming 
years. 

The scores were reported as 
follows. Third grade: math 90 
percent, reading 93 percent, 
writing 80 percent. Fifth grade: 
math 88 percent, reading 96 per-
cent, writing 84 percent. Exit 
level: math 89 percent, reading 
100 percent, writing 80 percent. 

her grandson Max Cunningham of 
Irving has come to the Burg to 

spend the summer and work. At 
present he is staying with his uncle 
and family, the Jimmy Steadhams. 

- -- 
Brad lund, of El Paso, has also 

returned to Forestburg to spend 
the summer here. He will be 
staying with his grandmother, 
Mrs. Louise Shults. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. LeRoy 0. Zunker 

of New Braunfels arrived at the 
Perryman Denham home in Dewey 
on Mon. p.m. May 14 and were 
visitors there till Mon. a.m. May 
21. LeRoy and Perryman got in 
some fishing while Marge and 
Myurt got in some visiting. The 
Price Truitts of Argyle came by 
Fri. p.m. the 18th to visit with 
everyone. LeRoy 0. Zunker is 
Myrt Denham's brother. 

- -- 
Keisha Dill daughter of Mr. and 

Mrs. Charles Dill, had her tonsils 
removed at Westgate Hospital in 
Denton Mon. a.m. May 21. Little 
Keisha should be home in a few 
days. 

- -- 
Mrs. Elsie Sampler of Decatur 

and Mrs. Louise Howard of 
Decatur visited with their sister 
recently. 

- -- 
Mike Berry and son Jamie and 

Linda Hughes of Denton were 
Mother's Day visitors in the Berry 
home. 



FOR SALE 
ANTIQUE AUCTION: FRIDAY, 
May 25, 1984 at 10 a.m. 500 West 
Howell St., Saint Jo. Texas. Lots of 
antique furniture, pewter, books, 
pistols, rifles, shotguns and much 
more. Liquidation for remodeling. 
A.L. Rusty Atkins, Auctioneer. 

nicie 

FOR SALE: 720 JOHN DEERE 
tractor. Wide front, 3 point. Clean. 
good condition. 759-2814. 	27-2C1 

FOR SALE: QUART JARS. 
Call Mrs. John Otto 715 Maple 
Street. 	 26,t 1 

FOR SALE: 3 YEAR OLD PIANO 
like new, upright. Played very little. 
Beautiful. 995-2683. 	262C1 

MELEX GOLF CART FOR SALE 
batteries in good condition. call 
759-2737. 	 - . s 

FOR SALE 
FLEA MARKET, JUNE 2 AND 3, 
9 a.m. to 5 p.m. Moose Lodge 1-35 
Gainesville. Spaces available. Call 
665.9593 or 665-0101. or ICI 

FOR SALE: GRANITE COOK-
ware and Mexican pottery and 
curios. Vist our new gift shop. 
Farmers Produce, 335 N. Grand, 
Gainesville. 21 -xcz 

FOR SALE: WE HAVE A NICE 
selection of South Texas fruit and 
vegetables. Farmers Produce, 335 
N. Grand. Gainesville. 21-X0 

FOR SALE: USED LIVING 
room chairs, used bedding set and 
used hospital bed. Hess Furniture, 
759-4455. 242C1 

FOR SALE: CUSHMAN GOLF 
Cart, good condition. 759-4439, 
'59-4579 or 759-2540. 	23-74(S 

HELP WANTED 
Experienced full-time dress sewing machine operators 
needed by Women's Quality Apparel Manufacturer. 
10 hour work day. Monday through Thursday 7:00 
a.m. tll 5:30 p.m. 

Alr Conditioned Building, Health & Life Insurance, 
Paid Vacation & Holidays, Clothing Discount 

Apply LORCH CO., 

Interstate 35 Service Road 
An Equal Opportunity Employer 

665-3072 
69'2(11'  

 

211-Zat 

WANTED 

HESS FURNITURE Is having a 

SALE 
SAVE 25% 

• KIRSCH MINI BLINDS 

• WOVEN WOODS 
• Choose from our large selection to 
compliment your room deter . 
• Benehi from our many years 
, ,t experience WE DO IT RIGHT 

Professional Installation 

202 N Main Muenster 759.4455 	 S- x s 

COMPLETE 
SERVICE 

DEPARTMENT 

MOBILE HOME 
INSURANCE 

Includmg Home Owners 

SALES OA SERVICE 

Dormey4r Baker 
MOBILE HOMES 

(817)668.7248 

WE REPAIR 
Sewing Machines 

and 

Vacuum Cleaners 
All Brands 

GAINESVILLE 
SEW-VAC 

328 E. Calif., 665-9812 
Across from Post Office 

AUCTION SALE 
FARM EQUIPMENT 

CATTLE - SHEEP 
12 O' Clock Sat - May 26 

FRANK STOFFELS 
1 M tie South to dial Gravel Rd , MOO 1 MHOS West Irons MuenSter. Texas 

CATTLE - 13 Calves - 25 Cows-all 5 yrs old & calfhood vaccinated 
SHEEP - 85 Ewes - 50 Lambs 

1980 L .7 0 Ford Car 
19713Chey. 314 ton 4 wheel drive Pickup 
Gleaner A Combine 
1 - MF 410 Diesel Combine with 14 It quick attach. 

header, Cab & Air, Maize guards 
1 - 1211 MF quick attach header with pickup attachment 
1 - Hume Reel • 14 fl. 
J G. 4020 tractor - Diesel - Dual Wheels 
J.O.4010 tractor with 4020 Kit 
J. O."A" tractor 
J.D."B" tractor 
J D 013100 - 8 Row Planter 
J D 8 Row Cultivator 
J D 6210- 141t. landum Disc. 
Bush Hog landum disc 1411. 
INC 11 It landum disc 
36 disc landum 
1 • J.D. Lister 7 row 
GP 14 It 13 shank chisel 3 P.T 

Case 3 Bottom Roll over Plow 
J D. 3 section Harrow 
Bush Hog 711. Cutler 
IHC 0510 • 16 Hole grain drill w / fertilizer attch 
J.D. 13 Hole grain drill w / fertilizer attch. 
Vermeer 8005 Round Baler 
MF 412 Haybaler 
IHC 0440 Wire tie Baler 
New Holland 0479 Hay Swather & Conditioner 
J.D. Side delivery Rake 
Vermeer Round Bale Mover 3 P T. w /Hyd 
Henry Hay loader 
Graves Hay loader 
Midland Zip Seeder 02E8 
J.D. Boom Sprayer 400 gal tank 
20 It Rope Wick Herbicide applicator 
J D imp. trailer 34 Ft. 
Donahue 0728 - 3011. trailer 
8 Round Bale feeders 

Lunch will Be Available 
FOR INFORMATION CONTACT 

Ward Brothers Auctioneers, Inc. 
AuGNONEERS Of I-11 41  I  StA II 1 151 S , OCI,  4441 HMI I'll,  ant, f CAIIPMf NI 

P O one rOY, 1900 Ill I IN/ n v 11041) 

817 665 4361 
THURMAN WARD 	 CECIL WARD 
665 - 3692 	 GAINESVILLE, TEXAS 	665 - 3167 

 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 
MOM AUCTION... 
 MISCAOENCI 
OVER MINTRO MAITER 

4.111110CMVIM 
1.07.1111 ■01, 

 

License No. TXE-015-0177 

LEVIS 
Our Prices 

Can't Be Beat 
Hoot ctrl-Shrink to fit Bells 

Hoy's & St udent 's  

tibm & Regular 
Commerce Street Store 

P.I. Brim*. OsinamIll. Ain 

FOR SALE 
FOR SALE: COUCH WITH 
Chair, S75. Call 759-4225. 	27•XS2 

OWN YOUR OWN JEAN• 
Sportswear, Ladies Apparel, Com-
bination, Accessories, Large Size 
store. National brands; Jordache, 
Chic, Lee, Levi, Vanderbilt, tend, 
Gunne Sax. Esprit, Brittania, 
Calvin Klein, Sergio Valente, Evan 
Picone, Claiborne, Members Only, 
Bill Blass, Organically Grown. 
Healthtex, 300 others. $7,900 to 
$24,900, inventory, airfare, 
training, fixtures, grand opening, 
etc. Mr. Loughlin (612)888-6555. 

2, 1CIP 

FOR SALE: WHIRLPOOL ELEC-
tric Range and Refrigerator. Harley 
Davidson Golf Cart on trailer with 
battery charger. Call 759-4443. 

27.151 

FOR SALE: NEW SHIPMENT OF 
Morgan Portable Buildings. 2429 
East Hwy. 82, Gainesville, Tx., 
817-665-3130. 26.1( 

FOR SALE: IHC 986 CAB WITH 
air and radio, all available 
hydraulics extras, like new, only 
900 hrs., 817-762-3500. 2.2( I 

FOR SALE: 24'08' FLATBED 
Neckover trailer. See at Wilde 
Chevrolet. Priced to sell. Phone 
759-2261 2e. v:1 

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 

November Election 

9flobern loom 
iaorrie tccoratinq 

& (Sifts 

Carpet - Vinyl - Tile 
Carpet Cleaning -

Wallpaper - Custom 
Window Treatment - 

Ceiling Fans 
Light Fixtures 

Fabrics Clocks Gifts 
209 N. Main. Muenster 

759 2848 

KARL KLEMENT 
AUTO SALES 

Clean, Quality Ca, 
6i Reasonable Prises 

115 North 11/ 	 Street 

Ph 8138 8921. Gainesville 

/5116' 

CARPETS 
Our prices quoted in-

clude complete, expert in-
stallation. 

You'll never have any 
surprise costs added when 
you select any of our 
quality floor coverings! 

• Carpet • Tile 
• Linoleum 

DALE'S 
CARPET SHOP 

Pat and Dale Martin 
665-2208, 668-6610, home 

319 N. Commerce ,., 
xul 

WANT RESULTS! 
TRY THE CLASSIFIEDS 

BREEDING 

Al BREEDER SERVICE, ABS 
Certified. Allison Schaff 817-665-
4291, III 6, Box 785, nratne,illn. 

For County Sheriff 

JOHN ASTON 
P. ■■■ 

Jahn Aston 
at 	 GOO 

...v. 

KENNETH MAC FITTS 
0.4 4 

leles.4w t ies.  

Om IMS Osinesville. 3E40 

FOR SALE 
FOR SALE: CEMETERY MON- 
omen., all sizes. Reasonably prised 
See J.P. Flusche or phone 759.221 5 

 or 759-2203. I s,  

FOR SALE: GLASS SHOWER 
doors, tub enclosurers, mirrors In 
all sizes. Installation  available. 
Comae! Ted Henschcid. 759.4280, 
Muenster. le-xt 

POLES FOR SALE. USED 
electric power line poles in assorted 
sizes and lengths for sale at Comm. 
unity Lumber Co. 759-2248, 
Muenster. 14-XC1  

TARPS FOR SALE: POLY-COAT 
sky blue, low cost, light weight 10 
cents per sq. ft. at Community 
Lumber Co., Muenster, 759.2248. 

2SSc I 

FOR HOME DELIVERY OR 
Fort Worth Slat Telegram or 

Dallas Times Herald 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

Box 546 Sanger 

WRANGLERS 
Shoes - Boots 

Work Dress Western 

Nocona Boots 
J.R. Hocker 

Men's & Boys' Store 
207 N Commerce, Sainesvolle 

"141 

FOR SALE 
IH 203 COMBINE 
13' Header, cab and air 
conditioning, windrow 

pickup attachment. 
Good Condition. 

Bayer 
759-2514 15 501 

Excellent 
Selection of 

Big, 
Well-Conditioned 

Hereford Bulls 
for Sale 

Bred for 
High Performance 

24% Tancb 
,S?uty. 82, 

Ulueniger, 'TX 76252 
817.665-6640 	817-668-8162 

P,,,,o,,„1 C.. 

7 Dares 	 not 
A Weak 	 uddesly useless 

Harnovel Of Fronk Deed Or DaelVed 
Cows And Horses 

7.1366-0763 
I we East 01 Gamosolie 

On mianwav 82 

NEW SHIPMENT 

off any Sleeper Sofas 

OTTS Furniture and Appliances 
G.E. Televisions 
Trane' Central Heat & Air 
Sales and Service 

115 S. Commerce, Gainesville, 665.6861 	,„, 

BUILDING MATERIALS 

IN STOCK 

Electrical - Plumbing 
Paneling - Roofing 

Hardware - Water Pumps 
Heating - Air-conditioning 
We can recommend an installer 

Muenster Building Center, Inc. 
M., :Isle( Tex 759 2232 

ARKCO 
House Leveling 

Specializing in cracked 
slabs, broken brick, and 
pier and beam. Drilled 

concrete beams 
Installed 

2 bedroom pier and beam 
leveled with original piers 

'387 

5 year warranty 
Free estimates 

817.665-3340 
or 885-8224 

14 Mil 

SERVICE 
MAS CLEANING SERVICE 

We do windows, spring houseclean-
ing and general housework. 759- 
456H. 759,4169, 759-2714 4, 

WILL DO MOWING AND HAY 
baling. Kevin Owen. 768-2758.174(cl 

TENDER, LOVING CARE DAY 
Care Center, 759-4964. 	u•SCI 

CUSTOM GRAIN 
WINDROWING 

Bill Bayer 
759-2514 „., 

WANT RESULTS! 
TRY THE CLASSIFIEDS 

G & H Backhoe 
& Dump Truck Service 

Herman Grewing, 
Bernard Hesse 

Sewer Systems 
Oil Field & Industrial Wor 

Ph. 759-4130 or 759-4304 
Mobil Ph. 759-4812._ 

4. 

A 

On 
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filet aVnne 
Ever hear about the one that got away? Chances are it landed in the Classifieds ... because that's the place where rarities are 
not so rare and gold mines are everywhere! The Classifieds offer an enormous collection of items, ideas and services that you 
can market for an incredibly low rate ... and net results! Just Gill 7594311 

91-1E 
UlASSIFIEDS 

IN THANKS 
Words cannot express our thanks 

to the many, many friends and 
relatives for their kind expressions 
of sympathy, prayers, Masses, and 
Rowers for our beloved Andy, and 
for the food sent to our family. 
Thanks to the Abbot of Subiaco, 
the seven priests and to Sister Car- 
melite for the beautiful liturgy and 
vigil services. Also thanks to the 
choral group, the CDA for the 
family meal and the KCs for the use 
of the hall. I will try to answer and 
thank each and every one of you 
personally in due time, God willing. 

WHY GOD? 
1 cannot see, 
I do not understand 
So suddenly like this. 
Fear overwhelmed me then; 
we loved him so, 
now miss him so. 
This must have been God's will. 
Now we can see Andy smiling al us 
from heaven's shining golden hill. 

Mrs. Andy Sehocch and family 
27-IC II'  

MISCELLANEOUS 
PUPPIES - HALF COLLIE - 
to give away. Playful and like 
children, 759.4485. 	 2220 

AUTO FOR SALE 

FOR SALE: 1982 KAWASAKI 
K DX 175 5850.00 Phone 759.2261 
or 759-4450. 	 26X:I 

FOR SALE: 1979 KAWASAKI SR 
650. Has 5000 miles. Excellent con- 
dition. 1900. Call 759-4234. oar e 

CATEkl,G TRUCK FOR SALE. 
Fully self-contained and equipped . 
C4111117-995-2966. 	 v. us: 

'Trailer Parts 
and Supplies 

Structural Steel 
and Pipe 

Complete Line 
of Bolts and 

Miscellaneous 
Hardware 

Metal Sales, Inc. 
On Highway 82 

West of Gainesville 

TELEVISIONS 
& VCR 

• Phileo • Fisher 

• Sylvania 

Video tapes, Vacuum 
Cleaners, Stereos, & 

Sewing Machines 
Sales & Service 

All Makes 

HUDGINS 
209 W Calif , Gainesville 

Phone 665-2542 

We Hutt 8 Sell 

NEW & USED FURNITURE 

NI- Mr LAND 

F 1 RNITURE 
665 2461. 665 0368 

INTERSTATE 
BATTERIES 

For GM, Ford & Chrysler 
Cars 8 Pickups & Heavy duty 

Trucks 

Prices beginning at 144 14 
for 36 month battery 

No membership needed for 
these batteries 

Knabe Tire 
& Radiator , 

105 it Minn Nuawar 759 4141 

Schilling Fina 

Oil & Gas 
Diesel. Gasoline 
Oil and Grease 

Propane 
759-2522 

Muenster, Tx. 76252 

Cakes Galore 
Call for Cakes 

All Occasion 

Birthdays, Adult, Children 
Showers & Anniversaries 

Also Sheet Cakes, 
Cupcakes, Character & 

Animal Cokes 
Also Silk Screening 

Sue Oakley 
759-4151 

NEEDLECRAFTERS 
Need 8 stitchery instructors, full or 
part time. Work your own hours 
Excellent income and promotion 
No experience necessary. Call Pam 
at 665-6493. 	 1 ,  2: 

LIVESTOCK 

BRANOUS 
Breeding age, registered bulls 
and heifers Certified free herd 

A&M Cattle Co. 
Near Gainesville, Texas 

817-606.3674 or 865.0550 
35,101 

DISPLAY BUILDING SALE 
Introducing Sam Burnitt as your 
local Standard Steel Building 
representative. Standard is of 
feting, for a limited time, our 1600 
sq. ft., 40' x 40' all steel arch-style 
building, solid endwalls with one 
big 18' x In -  double sliding door 
opening, ready to erect $3,995.00. 
Similar discounts on other sizes. 
CALL 1-800-442-4584. 2, 1(1  

TAKING 
APPLICATIONS 

For Production 
Employees. 

Jamark Mfg. Inc. 
ForeMburg. 

Inquire in person, 
7 a.m. - 4:30 p.m., 
Mon. thru Thurs. 

Start above minimum 7, 

wage/holidays/ 	r'  
insurance/paid vacation. 

FOR RENT 
SMALL FIIIINICHFII 

for rent in Myra. Suitable for 
couple or one person. 736-2242. 

2T-M_ I 

SAFE DEPOSIT BOXES: NEN 
section of larger boxes for rent at 
Muenster State Bank J9 

MOBILEHOME FOR RENT. 2 
bid, fully furnished. a block from 
school on N. Walnut. Ph. 759-
29)8. Jerome Pagel .  

NOW LEASING 
U•Store and Lock 

Mini Storage 

759-4621 
514 E 1st St . Muenster 

I 1141 

1, 2, and 3 BEDROOM APPARI-
maw, and houses. Rent based on 
income to eligible elderly, han-
dicapped, and low income families. 
Housing Authority of the City of 
Gainesville. 817-665-1747. Specially 
designed units (or handicapped 
available. Equal oppori unity 
housing 817.665-1747. 

cr 
Foos ,  Oppostonoss 

No..6 

HOLLYWOOD GARAGE DOORS, 
residential and commercial, Muens- 
ter 	Building 	Center. 	5-XCI 

* * * * * * 
For Free Classified Ads 

In our next Shopper 

Call 759.4311 

* * * * * * * 
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REAL ESTATE SERVICE FARM & 
RANCH 

Market Report 
by Bill Hamer 

carpets the best way 

MARY'S 
CARPET CARE I

"Let me clean your 

7 5 9-2 506 
Circular Do Foam Systems 

for Horne or Commerclel Corpus 

Wes and Polish Wood floors 

No Job Too Big 
or Too Small 

Mary Alice Bayer 
Muenster 

Carpenter Work 
Wanted 

Also odd jobs 
Reasonable rates 	_ 

Erni. Martin 759-4050 

Septic Tank and 

Grease Trap cleaning 

159 4522 759 4158 159 2522 

The tiny pests insert their 
sucking mouthparts into young 
tissue and begin to feed, causing 
galls to form. These galls continue 
to grow and envelop feeding 
phylloxera. 

Inside 	the 	galls 	female 
phylloxera lay many eggs which 
hatch in just a few days. Adults 
and nymphs continue to feed in-
side galls for one to three weeks. 
Galls then split, releasing 
phylloxera to migrate and lay eggs 
for a second generation. Second 
generation females produce eggs 
which lie dormant on the tree until 
the following spring. 

We are past the time now for 
phylloxera control. Homeowners 
should evaluate their trees and 
plan to spray next year if you have 
a high level of leaf gall infestation 
or medium level of stem in-
festation. The insects tend to not 
move great distances. 

Happy Birthday, 
Timmy Fernandez 

Save Money! 
Save Time! 

Prescription Is our Middle Name. 

Shop the Drive-in Window 
for all your prescriptions 

and drug needs. 

WATTS' 
PRESCRIPTION SHOP 

302 N. Grand, Gainesville 

It pays to 
topdress 
pastures. 

Pastures are too often overlooked in an otherwise comprehensive fertility Pastures  
program 

The fact is. proper fertilization of pasture will greatly increase meat and 
milk production. You II see faster weight gain, more pounds of gain per acre, 

a longer grazing season and greater carrying capacity It can also 

dramatically increase your milk production.  
Begin with a soil lest. Then apply the fertilizer shown to be needed Add 

lime. if your soil is found high in acidity 
Let our Fertilizer Specialist help you He has the know-how and we have the 

materials Come see us soon We're ready when you are 

RED RIVER 
FARM CO-OP 

Standing together. 	1300 N Dixon 665-4338 
Gainesville 	s . 

Standing strong. 

COOP 

Easy 
Walkiri! 

Let Red Wing 
comfort and lit 
soften the loll 
between your 

feet and concrete 
or other hard 

surfaces. Every 
day will go better.  

Stop in ,  

Red Wings 
WAYNE'S Lost Luggage 

209 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

If You Don't Tell People,, 
They'll Never Know 

When you have items you'd like to sell, 
telling people with a classified ad is as easy as 

calling 759-4311 

FS-50E Trimmer 
• Tool Box 
• Wall Bracket 
• Goggles 

• Auto-cut head 

Garden Center 
Muenster 

“ 	i if  

	

$169P 	. ri 

	

Special 	

tk " . 1.. 

4.0( 

Fs of  FS-50E 

	

Ld.,t' ,, 	Alii  

• a2 Oz Engine Oil 
• Gloves 

502 N Main, 759.2786. 

8 a.m.-5:30 p.m. Mon. thru Frl. 8 a.m.-Noon Sat. 

• C/ 

I 	, 

FOR SALE 
Village Recreation Center Windthorst, Texas 76389. If you are to 
old for the daily grind and too young to sit and rust up this could 
be for you. 40' x 100' metal building, insulated, paneled and air-
conditioned. 4 bowling lanes and other fixtures and equipment 
1.17 acres of land, room for other adventures. 

Mr. and Mrs. W.V. Weinzapfel 
	

25 I 

ST/HL 
THE WORLD'S LARGEST SELLING CHAIN SAW 

3 BDRM. BRICK 
HOME FOR SALE 

Fenced in yard, lots of 
trees workshop, water 

well underground 
sprinkler system. 

228 S. Pine, Muenster 
759.4303 

FOR SALE 
Mary F. Luke 

Estate 

Consisting of 138.5 
acres, more or less, 
bounded on two sides 
by city limits and oil 
production. Part of min-
eral interest will go with 
sale. Ideal for com-
mercial or residential 
sub-division. 

Contact 
Bill or Tony Luke 

759.2215 or 759.2298 
25-x131 

For FREE Classifieds 
in our next Shopper 

Call 759-4311 

Secluded! Trees! 
Passim Solar Design 

FOR SALE 
Wooded 	setting 	Inciuvoi 
White‘boro and Lake Tex cmia 
gigantic living-den-kitchen 
area, 2 Bedroom with room for 
3rd. On 7 acres with barn 

817-665-1318 

FOR SALE: 
14 x 65 MOBILE HOME 

By Owner 

Town and Country, 2 bedrooms. 
I'd: bath, 10x10 storage shed, 
single carport, 12440 awning. 

central heat & air. Good condition. 

817-665-6147 or 759-2514 
X131 

0 • Auto 

• Life 

*Horne 

•-- •V• 

......- 
*---'. 	• Crop 

• Health 

, 

John S. Bartush 

Cooke County 
Farm Bureau 

Hume 	 Business 

817-759-4215 	817-665-1763 

We have been 
approved to store 
grain in all federal 

programs 

...Payment in Kind (PIK) 

... Government Loan 

...Government Reserve 

Let us buy or store 
your grain. 

TONY'S SEED & FEED 
Muenster and Gainesville 

ASPHALT SELF-SEALING 

ROOF SHINGLES 
lasting Mau. fa. Vow Mom. 
• ■•11.... • Voris. Of coo.. 

Muenster Building Center, Inc. 
421 N. Main, 759-2232 

Batteries for Your Lawn 
Mowers Thru Your 

4-Wheel Drive Tractors 
We also have 

Bumper and grill 

guards 
Side rails and 

running boards and 

other accessories 
for your Pick-ups 
and Vans. 

Jim's Battery Service 
Open Mon. thru Fri. till 5:30 p.m., Sat. till 12 noon 

1504 N. Culberson, Gainesville, 668-6127 
Jim Wilson, Glenn Nehib, Owners 

New and Used 

FARM EQUIPMENT 
REPAIRS 

SICKING 
TRACTOR 

204 Summit Ave., Gainesville 
817.88541971 

Neat 

Rest Values 
comae rov 

JUNE 6 
Arr•Ofir.irl r=rriflig rOf 

MAY 31 
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FOR SALE: BRICK HOUSE, 1 
full bath, 2 half-baths; 3 or 4 
bedrooms, central heat/air; storm 
windows fully insulated, 2-car 
garage, fenced back yard. Call 759-
4514. 111,C2 

WANTED: LISTINGS 10 ACRES 
and up, prefer some timber in Mue-
nster, Rosston, Forestburg, Saint J o 

 area. Town & Country Real Estate 
665-2875 or Roscoe Raymond 
995-2366 tout : 

11■11-111:1AIIIIP 
THE WORLD'S LARGEST SELLING CHAIN SAW 

LET US BUY YOUR 

Top Market Prices 
USDA Approved 

FOR PIK GRAIN and CCC LOAN GRAIN 

NO LONG WAITS 
— NO SHORT WEIGHTS 

MUENSTER MILLING CO. 
Elevator Phone 759-2829 Mill phone 759-2287  

NEED YOUR HAY 
ROUND BALED? 

Call 768-2216 
in the evenings. 

BILL BLACK 
Electrical Service 

Call for any 
electrical problem 

Oil Field, Industrial 
or Residential 

738.2227 (Myra) 
no orons • u 

738-2242 

PLUMBING 
Installation & Repair 
Residentlel & Commereish 
FIXTURES, SUPPLIES 
MeDoneld Water Pumps 

Robert Russell Plumbing 
759-4155 

Muenster 

Recently many homeowners 
have been noticing the bumps or 
galls appearing on their pecan tree 
leaves and stems. This is the result 
of a tiny insect called the pecan 
phylloxera. 

Phylloxera, tiny yellow, soft-
bodied insects that look like 
aphids, can damage pecans 
severely unless controlled. The 
pests attack leaves, tender shoots, 
leaf stems, catkins and nutlets. 

Phylloxera can be controlled 
with dormant oil or the insec-
ticides, malathion and phosalone 
(Zolone), but not now. Wait until 
next year. 

Apply dormant oil at the rate of 
four gallons of 97 percent oil 
emulsion per 100 gallons of water. 
Spray prior to bud-break and 
when the temperature is between 
40 and 70 degrees F. Be sure to 
thoroughly cover the tree's trunk 
and branches. 

Malathion and phosalone may 
also be applied at bud-break. Use 
25 percent WP malathion at the 
rate of three pounds per 100 
gallons of water. Apply 34.4 per-
cent EC phosalone at one and one-
third pints per 100 gallons of 
water at three-day intervals until 
leaves are one-third grown or until 
egg-hatch ceases. 

Phylloxera overwinter in the egg 
stage and can be found in protec-
ted areas on pecan trees, such as 
under bark and in crevices. Over-
wintered eggs hatch in early spring 
and migrate to newly developing 
leaves and twigs. 

Last week's sale tally: 683 cat-
tle, 55 hogs. Stocker and feeder 
calves, yearlings and hogs were 

HOGS 
Gd.-Choice 180-275 lbs. 844-846 
Gd. Butchers 125-180 lbs. 842-544 
Packing Sows .. All Wts. 534-838 

COWS 
Gd.- Choice 	  538-540 
Med.-Gd. 	 535-538.50 
Canners-Cutters 	 525-535 
Hard Kinds 	  510-525 
Stocker Cows 	 8325-8450 
Cow w/calf at side .. 	5400-5525 

steady. Cows and bulls were 
steady to strong. 

STOCKER CALVES 
Steer Calves 	 865-880 
Steer Yearlings 	 855-562 
Heifer Calves 	 855-560 
Heifer Yearlings 848-856 
Heifer 	  2 yrs. 546-852 

BULLS 
Gd.-Choice 	  545-848 
Med.-Good 	  542-545 
Commons 	  540-842 
Feeders 	  848-555 

RON HESS, REAL ESTATE 
broker, land or residential. Phone 
759-2232 or 759-4864. 	t•xcl 

FOR SALE: 3 BEDROOM, 2 
bath, brick home, 925 N. Cedar . 

Phone 759-4301 for appointment 
22 , 7.1 

2I•XC I 

SUPER BUY: 1983 CHAMPION 
Titan. 14 x 70, energy saver, 2 bdr 
ms., 2 baths. Assume payments. 
Call after 6, 817-668-6527. zs-ad in 

County Agent's 
Report 

by Craig Rosenbaum 

WHEAT 

OATS 
BARLEY 



Spring Clearance Sale 
Selected trees, shrubs, 

and bedding plants 

30% OFF 
Plain and antiqued 

bird baths and concrete 
planters 

20% OFF 

Uooffork 2.anbc3cap0 
31/2 Mlles East of Gainesville 

Highway 82 
885.8311 	

27 o 

Katie and Faye spent Thursday 
night with Odessa and Friday they 
all visited Mrs. Inez Stevens and 
Mrs. Mary Ruth Kindiger, then 
returned to their homes. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. C.W. Martin 

were in Muenster Friday after-
noon. 

Wesley Holley of Whitesboro 
visited Miss Lois Bewley, Clyde 
and Lonnie Wednesday after-
noon. 

- -- 
Mrs. Lyndel Richardson and 

Mrs. Wilma Richardson were in 
Denton Wednesday on business. 

Mrs. Gladys Balthroo attended 
the baccalaureate services for the 
Era graduating class at the United 
Methodist Church in Era, Sunday 
evening. Her grandson, David 
Wayne Kirk, was a member of the 
class. 

- -- 
Mrs. Ruth Ann McKinney 

assistant city manager of Fort 
Worth visited her mother Mrs. 
Mary Ruth Kindiger and other 
relatives during the weekend. 

Mrs. Estelle Kelley spent Friday 
night with her sister Mrs. Iva Ford 
in Era. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Ross Sutton of 

Arlington visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Travis Sutton Sunday. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. T.J. Amis of 

Plano visited her mother Mrs. 
Estelle Kelley Saturday afternoon. 

--- 
Mrs. Inez Stevens and Mrs. 

Mary Ruth Kindiger met and had 
lunch with Mrs. Mark Chapman, 
Deidra and her friend Ginney, of 
Commerce. _-- 

Mrs. Lyndel Richardson atten-
ded a Barbecue cook out at Muen-
ster at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
David Billie and family. Others at-
tending were Mr. and Mrs. Grady 
Roller and family of Lindsay, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dan Richardson, Susan 
and Sharron and Charles Hess. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. L.L. (Bill) Biffle 

accompanied Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Howard of Lane, OK. to 
Dallas Monday. Bill received his 
treatment and they returned home 
in the afternoon. 

************ 
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Mthe Pepsi  * $649 * 	CASE 
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99 4  
u.49s 
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0,11111/1.7 S'Auv. 82, 971uerti3ter 

MEMORIAL HOLIDAY WEEKEND 

PRESTON 

MILK 
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Hunts Hunts Ketchup 

24 OZ. 89 4 
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Lion I wrn. Ti) 111C10$1 
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Bar.134 Sauce 
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10111111111110111 	n 001 
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11112.1.....i= 
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ICEBERG 
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thru May 31, 1984 
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10/1111 
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NI- TIN 

Instant Tea 
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Pepper 	IL 79' 
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MI IA 11301711 
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1149 
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Drumsticks 	1 2 2' 
Lemonade 21% 
111117171 Ile. NI n. WW1 

Cool Whip Topping 
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unseal WHILE 	 ` 

Cauliflower 

RetS"weet  Onions  49
0 

 FRANKS  124179_si 11  69 SIIIIRFRESIE MEAT 

sits 
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IN OUR DAIRY DEPARTMENT 	K 

PARKAY MARGARINE 
emisrs 

1 LB. CARTON 

Biscuits:mg= ''''' 	 4 Ls. $ 1 DO 
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Kraft Cheddars'"'""',.... '2" 
Pimento Cheese Spread""`.. '1" 
Florida Citrus Punch""'"'":.., 	'1" 
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This picture was made about 40 miles south of Manila in the Philip-
pines, on top of a high monument. Can you guess who this young man 
on the left is? 
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Salvage 
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Ash Plywood 

Paneling 
4x8', 1/4" 
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$850 

per sheet 
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LUMBER CO. 

200 E. Division 
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The wedding of James Penton 
and Tammy Adams has been 
postponed. 

- -- 
Last week's picture was of J.C. 

and Dorothy Barr of Nocona, 
formerly of Rosston. 

Mrs. Irene Harry had as her 
guests Sunday May 20, her 
daughters Mrs. Maxine Peers of 
Krum and Mrs. Montez Nivens of 
Denton and Mrs. Corvilla 
Robeson. They spent the day and 
had lunch with Irene. 

--- 
Mrs. Susie Prather spent Thur-

sday afternoon with Mrs. Lyndel 
Richardson. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Maberry 

went to Wichita Falls Sunday 20. 
They met their friends Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Fisher and son Toby of 
Chattangotta, Ok. and all had 
lunch together. On their way 
home the Maberry's stopped by 
for a brief visit with an old friend, 
Mrs. Koethe in Henrietta. 

--- 
Miss Lois Bewley and Mrs. 

C.H. Christian went to Bowie 
Wednesday afternoon where they 
visited Mrs. Ima King and found 
her doing nicely after having hip 
surgery, in a Fort Worth hospital. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Hutson 

and Brad had as their guests 
during the weekend, Kenda Hut-
son, Mr. and Mrs. Neil Thompson 
all of Saint Jo, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ricky Gaston and family of 
Gainesville. 

- -- 
Mrs. Lyndel Richardson had as 

her guest Sunday afternoon her 
granddaughter Mrs. Grady Roller 
and son John Thomas of Lindsay. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Kelley 

of Irving spent the weekend with 
his mother Mrs. Estelle Kelley and 
went fishing. 

J.C. Maugh

- 

an of Lubbock 
visited his mother Mrs. Mae 
Maughan over the weekend. 

- -- 
Mrs. Delia Sutton of Gainesville 

was a visitor at the Nazarene 
Church in Prairie Point Sunday. 

- -- 
Mrs. W.E. Ewing reports that 

her daughters and their families 
have returned to their homes after 
spending a few days here visiting, 
also her sister-in-law Mrs. Bamma 
Brown returned to her home in 
Dallas and would fly to Houston 
for a visit. 

- -- 
C.H. Christian presented his 

wife with a beautiful corsage for 
mother's day then treated her to 
lunch in Gainesville Sunday May 
13. All three of their sons Jimmy 
of Springtown, Bill and Fred of 
Stephenville called and wised Ruth 
a Happy Mother's Day. 

--- 
Mrs. Estelle Kelley visited her 

sister Mrs. Emma Lee Steadham 
in Forestburg and they both at-
tended the funeral of Arnold 
Shults. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Travis Sutton had 

as their guests their daughter and 
two children and Mr. and Mrs. 
Darrell Sutton and baby Sunday 
and they all attended Church at 
the Nazarene Church at Prairie 
Point. 

Mrs. Jack Berry met her sisters 
Mrs. Johnnie Cook of Forney and 
Mrs. Lee McKown of Dallas at 
Valley View Thursday and they all 
had lunch together in Gainesville 
then they visited Vergie Fennel. 

Rosston 
News 

  

 

by Ruth Smith 

News of the Sick 
Mrs. Mary Bierschenk of Valley 

View is a patient at Flow Hospital 
in Denton where she underwent 
surgery Wednesday. Cards may be 
sent to Room 3116, Flow 
Memorial Hospital, Denton, 
Texas 76201 or Box 56, Valley 
View, Texas 76272. 

Phone 759-4311 to report news 
of graduation activities and par-
ties; about guests who came from 
out-of-town to attend graduations 
in Muenster, and trips made out of 
town to attend graduations in 
other towns. Also please tell The 
Enterprise about college 
graduations, and bring photos of 
college graduates. 

Personal 
Mr. and Mrs. J.A. Klement are 

getting settled in their new home 
on Maple St. since moving from 
their country home last Saturday. 
Assisting them with the move were 
family members Sug and Harold 
Bindel, Joan and Dick Schleicher 
of Fort Worth, Jerry Klement and 

Cori and Kurt of Temple, Helen 
Schleicher of Dallas and Susan 
Birchfield of Arlington, and a 
number of neighbors and friends. 
The Klements' granddaughter and 
family Debbie and Kim Hale and 
infant Krystal are moving into 
their rural home northeast of 
Muenster. 

I 	fay 
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