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Good news for Reagan su-
pporters is this week's poll 
report showing that he has 
moved back into the lead af-
ter trailing the president 
only a week ago. As might 
be expected, the change has 
newsmen wondering 
whether this is a reaction to 
the mean campaigning that 
Carter has done lately, or 
whether it's a previous 
failure to read all of the 
available signs. 

Democrats who gloated 
early in the race about 
Reagan sticking his foot in 
his mouth in the Taiwan and 
evolution statements et a 
big shock a few weeks later 
when Carter called his op-
ponent a "racist" and pur-
veyor of "hatred." Next 
they heard him say that the 
election is a choice between 
peace and war, adding that 
history shows him to be the 
peace candidate. 

This kind of personal att-
ack has no appeal whatever 
to calm citizens and actually 
antagonizes many, which 
can be important to persons 
who still have to decide. 
Understandably party 
leaders were disturbed by 
the mean mouthing. 
Possibly it is reflecting in the 
polls. 

Also possibly reflected in 
the polls is a slippage of the 
president's support among 
people who backed him in 
the 1976 election. A number 
of metropolitan papers 
sampled precincts and com-
pared their findings with the 
previous voting records, 
finding that Carter did bet-
ter in 1976. 

Me Carter strategy, app-
arently is to goad Reagan in-
to making unwise statements 
of his own which the cam-
paign machine can exploit in 
presenting him as irrespon-
sible and incompetent. 
Meanwhile Carter makes his 
principal appeal to sectors 
of society which are im-
pressed by what he promises 
to do for them. He hopes to 
acquire a fat total of votes 
from a flock of minorities 
like blacks and browns, 
welfare beneficiaries, no-
nuke advocates, gays, left 
wingers and what not. His 
big problem, though, is get-
ting their full support. For 
instance he can't be certain 
that all blacks and browns 
will go along with their 
leaders, or that union mem-
bers will vote as union 
bosses say, or that teachers 
will take their advice from 
the Department of 
Education. 

While American politics is 
officially divided into 
Democratic and Republican, 
the American public is 
dividing more and more into 
conservative and liberal. 
The trend has been 
especially evident this year 
as millions of citizens are 
swinging over to the conser-
vatism of the Republican 
party. After four years of 
the Carter administration 
they have had a belly full, 
and they want a change. 

Specific compaints can be 
named by the dozens in 
which Carter and associates 
promised to improve all 
segments of the economic 
system..."you can depend 
on that"... but taxes and 
spending and interest rates 
and the national debt are all 
higher. 

He said he would streng-
then national defense so as 
to command world respect 
but scrapped vital weapons 
like the neutron bomb, the 
MX mobile missile, the B-1 
bomer and a badly needed 
shipbuilding program. 
Meanwhile he cooperated in 
detante and the SALT 
programs which support the 
Soviet military and handicap 
ours. In many cases the Car-
ter policy has appeared to be 
more Soviet than American. 

The same attitude applies 
to foreign policy, which is 

Continued on Page 14 

Group attendance at Mass 
followed by a communion 
breakfast will be the first 
event in this year's obser-
vance of Columbus Day by 
members of the Muenster 
Knights of Columbus. 

The dual observance, 
celebrating the feast of the 
KCs' patron begins at the 9 
a.m. Mass in Sacred Heart 
Church, where members are 
asked to gather in an area 
that has been reserved for 
them. Widows of deceased 
members are invited to at-
tend as special guests. A 
feature of the service will be 
the council's annual presen-
tation of its Good Neighbor 
Award, which is given in the 
spirit of ecumenical good 
will to someone of another 
faith. 

The church service will be 
followed by communion 
breakfast in the KC Hall 
with the Good Neighbor as 

Planning for the Muen-
ster's 1980-81 United Way 
Campaign got started this 
week with the appointment 
of Monica Hess as com-
munity chairman, and 
Johnny Pagel and Henry 
Weinzapfel as co-chairmen. 
They whave chosen October 
14 for their kickoff date, 
and until then will be busy 
recruiting workers and 
preparing the packets for 
prospective donors. 

The kickoff will be held at 
the regular Chamber of 
Commerce luncheon 
meeting with a film 
preceding the distribution of 
packets. All workers, 
whether or not they are 
chamber members, will be 
encouraged to attend. 

Muenster's 	activity 
follows the county United 
Way drive which had its 
kickoff meeting last Mon-
day, Sept. 29 at K-Bob's 
Steak House with Tom Par-
sons as the 1980-81 president 
and Johnny Leftwich as 
campaign chairman. The 
adopted goal is $112,804, 

Saturday's Harvest Hoe-
down turned out to be 
somewhat less than expec-
ted, but nobody is down 
hearted. The absence of 
crowds was more than offset 
by the presence of a good, 
soaking million dollar rain. 
It was what the community  

honored guest and Past 
State Deputy Don Sauer-
mann as the speaker. 
Sauermann is also known to 
many local people for his 
weekly TV commercials for 
Haverty's and Wine of the 
Week. Wayne Klement will 
be master of ceremonies for 
the breakfast. 

The second part of the 
Columbus Day observance 
is the council's social gala of 
the year, a dance in the KC 
Hall Saturday night, Oct. 
11. Everyone is welcome. 
Following a happy hour at 
7, the dance starts at 8 with 
music by Ed Landry's or-
chestra, which is recom-
mended by people who at-
tended the Jaycee in-
stallation dance. Reser-
vations can be obtained by 
calling the KC Club or 
Grand Knight Harold 
Flusche. 

which is described as a 
major challenge for the 
people of Cooke County, 
but the committee is con-
fident "this record breaking 
goal will be reached or ex-
ceeded." 

As pointed out by Par-
sons, "When you give 
through United Way, you 
don't feel like you're helping 
some people at the expense 
of others, because your one 
gift helps support services 
that cover practically the en-
tire range of human needs. 
And volunteers... local 
people like yourself... spend 
long hours going over 
budgets and needs in order 
to decide where the money 
can best be used. So you 
don't need to choose when 
you just want to help as 
much as you can." 

Cooke County United 
Way supports thirteen agen-
cies as follows. American 
Red Cross, $13,500; Boy 
Scouts of America, $8,700; 
Camp Fire Girls, $20,000; 
Council on Alcoholism, 
$1,330; Cooke County 4-H 
and FFA, $3,500; 

has been waiting and 
praying for ... for months. 

Even so, downtown ac-
tivity wasn't a complete 
washout, according to Den-
nis Hess, the Hoedown 
chairman. Store traffic was 
better than normal. And the 

The backed-up quota of 
months of moisture was 
poured on Muenster during 
the past weekend. As if 
measuring the shortage since 
the first of June, the boun-
tiful clouds delivered 7.90 
inches in three days of 
soakers. 

Readings 	on 	Steve 
Moster's gauge were 2.28 in-
ches on September 27, 3.52 
on the 28th, 2.06 on the 
29th, and .04 on the 30th. 
Combined with 1.04 earlier 
in the month it makes 8.94 
inches for September, the 
third high total for the mon-
th on the local record. The 
wettest were Sept. '62, 11.11 
and Sept. '64, 11.12. 

However there are other 
records. The 7.90 is the 

biggest 	for any three 
sussessive days since the 
record was started in 1946. 
September '72 was close 

Gainesville 	Boys 	Club, 
$37,200; Muenster Youth 
Council, $2,500; Salvation 
Army, $8,000; Southwestern 
Diabetic Foundation, 
$7,500; United Service 
Organization (USO) $650; 
North Texas Radio Reading 
Service, $144; Mini-Bus Ser-
vice, $1,250; Texas United 
Way, $330. 

A new store for Muenster 
is R&J's Western Wear, 
operating in the gift depar-
tment of the former Gehrig 
Hardware location since last 
week. The initials stand for 
Rex Simmons and Jim 
Gehrig. 

Operators of the store are 
Rex and Donna Simmons, 
Donna on a full time 
schedule and Rex part time. 
Jim and Cindy Gehrig will 
continue at Gehrig Har-
dware. 

drawing for free tickets to 
the Cowboy game was held 
on schedule, the winners 
being Dorothy Hartman and 
Bernard Hesse. Each got a 
group of four tickets, the 
opportunity to host a game 
party as guests of the 
Chamber of Commerce. 

with 7.86 for 3 days and July 
73 received 7.33. Also Oc-
tober '59 had 6.90 in 3 days. 

Other big figures 
discovered in the search for 
3-day records were a few 
single day whoppers. The 
record holder is 6.65 on 
August 14, 1971, including a 
6 inch deluge in 2 hours. 
Other big 1-day rains were ' 
6.15 inches on Oct. 31, '74; 
4.5 on Oct. 4, '59; 4.45 on 
May 17, '64; 4.57 on July 
29, '73. 

The wettest months on 

At this time the store is 

operating with a partial 
stock, expecting to receive 
its supply of jeans and 

western shirts along with 
other items early in Novem-
ber. The stock of cowboy 
boots and work boots for- 

merly at the hardware store, 
has been moved to the 
western store, and at the 
same time other shipments 
of merchandise have 
arrived. 

Principal items now in 
stock are cowboy boots, 
work boots, felt and straw 

Little Ronnie Knabe's 
long struggle with leukemia 
came to an end last Sunday 
at 12:05 p.m. in the Cook 
Children's hospital of Fort 
Worth. He had been a 
patient there for 10 weeks 
receiving daily transfusions 
from relatives and friends of 
Muenster and Dallas. His 
illness began 10 months ago. 

Rosary services for him 
were held Tuesday at 4 and 8 
p.m. in the chapel of Nick 
Miller Funeral Home, and 
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record were April '57 with 
12.43; May '70, 11.61 and 
September of '62 and '64 
with 11.11 and 11.12 respec-
tively. 

As regards the drought 
just past, the readings were 
1.61 in June, .26 in July and 
.12 in August a total of 1.99 
inches in 3 months. At this 
time, the year's total 
moisture is 18.69, far behind 
normal for this time of the 
year. Actually, this total for 
nine months is about half of 
a year's normal. 

cowboy hats, belts, buckles, 
feather hat bands and 

western 	dress 	shirts. 
Featured brands are Nocona 
and Texas cowboy boots, 
Santa Rosa work boots, 

Justin belts and buckles, 
Royce felt hats, Fairfield 
straws, Woodland and Bor-
dertown shirts. Jeans and 

shirts on order are Wrangler 
and Loren. 

A service to be added 
soon is dry cleaning. Acme 

Cleaners of Gainesville will 
pick up and deliver at the 
store twice a week. 

the funeral was held at 10 
a.m. Wednesday in Sacred 
Heart Church with five 
priests con-celebrating in the 
Mass of Christian Burial. 
They were Father Paul 
Hoedebeck, Father Dan 
Williams, Father Placidus 
Eckart, Father Stephen 
Eckart and Father Denis 
Soerries. 

Burial was in the parish 
cemetery directed by Nick 
Miller with Charles Knabe, 
David Reiter, Leonard 

NUMBER 46 

Still more records have 
been set by the temperature. 
The heat wave brought a 
total of 80 days over 100 
during the summer, in-
cluding 42 consecutive days. 

Delightfully mild tem-
peratures of the past week 
were recorded as follows by 
Steve Moster. Sept. 25, 71 
and 85; Sept. 26, 68 and 77; 
Sept. 27, 55 and 55; Sept. 
28, 53 and 60; Sept. 29, 57 
and 68; Sept. 30, 62 and 75; 
Oct. I, 60 and 82. 

County is Eligible 
For Drought Aid 
The Small Business Adm-

inistration has designated 
Cooke County eligible for 
disaster relief due to 
drought, Congressman 
Charles W. Stenholm an-
nounced today. 

Farmers in the county can 
apply to their Regional 
Small Business Ad- 
ministration office to 
recover losses caused by 
drought from April I, 1980 
through August 21, 1980, 
Stenholm said. 

Applications for physical 
damage should be filed 
before February 12, 1981 
and for economic losses 
before May 12, 1981. 

Adjacent counties are also 
eligible for assistance. 

Reiter and David Vogel as 
pallbearers. 

Ronnie was born in Fort 
Worth on February 16, 1970 
a son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gilbert Knabe. He was a fif-
th grader in Muenster Public 
School. 

Survivors are his parents; 
a sister, Mary; two brothers, 
Brian and Cory, his mater-
nal grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Hoedebeck and 
his paternal grandfather, 
Joe Knabe. 

Observe 
FIRE 

Prevention 
Week 

October 
5-11 

Owners of R&J's Western Wear are 
currently stocking Muenster's newest 
business in the location formerly occupied 
by the gift department of Gehrig Har-
dware. Shown with the antique cash 

United Way Kicks Off Oct. 14 

register used by the late Wm. Gehrig, 
third generation ancestor, are Rex and 
Donna Simmons and Cindy and Jim 
Gehrig. Staff Photo 

Hoedown Gets Rain 
Instead of Crowd 

Western Store Opens 

Knights of Columbus Observe 
Columbus Day October 5 Drought and Heat Wave Busted 

Ronnie Knabe Dies of Lukemia 
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Looking Ahead 
Dr George S Benson 

	
EDUCATION PROGRAM 

Searcy, Arkansas 

AG Briefs 
Texas Ally. General Mark 

White. In legal opinions is-
sued last week, ruled: 

—For purposes of Section 
21.301 (al of the Texas Edu-
cation Code. "current term' 
means the period beginning 
with the first day of sched-
uled in-service training and 
ending with the first day of 
scheduled in-service training 
the following year. 

—Public school teachers 
may not be required to pay 
for substitutes necessitated 
by their absence while en-
gaged in military training or 
duty. 

leak at Todd Shipyards in 
Galveston. 

The shipyard is the storage 
site for controversial low 
level nuclear waste that has 
been building up in Texas 
for the past two years . 

Schwartz has consistently 
spurred the shipyard to 
transfer its waste, but the re-
moval has been slow. He 
called the plutonium report 
"the last straw" in a series of 
inept waste handling. 

55 
SAVES 
LIVES 
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One of the most encouraging signs for cur nation's 
future I've seen this year is the surge of concern about the 
state of our nation's defenses. 

People are demanding answers to tough questions 
about our nation's ability to defend its interests in the 
world. The very fact that you are asking the questions has 
led to a change in attitude in Washington. Defense has 
moved off the back burner as an issue and a priority. 

Unfortunately, the answers to questions about our 
readiness are discouraging. We are short of everything from 
bullets to manpower. We are being out-spent by the Soviet 
Union in almost every area of national defense. Our fleet is 
sorely in need of more and more modern ships. Our ability 
to transport men and equipment to trouble spots 
throughout the world is alarmingly inadequate. We have 
been reduced to a foreign policy .  of bluff and rhetoric in too 
many areas. 

We still have an awesome military machine. But we 
must act now if we are to stop the deterioration of our 
relative strength and begin the slow and expensive process 
of rebuilding. 

I am optimistic that we can do that. because the people 
of this great nation are leading their leaders to the 
conclusion that we must take the necessary steps to 
accomplish that goal. 

What, specifically, must we do? Congress has already 
taken the first step by adding some S6 billion to the 
President's requested defense budget for the fiscal year 
beginning in October. We also added another 31.6 billion 
for military pay and benefits. With sufficient public 
pressure and interest, I believe that we can get the necessary 
money to carry through with the authorized program. 

But we still fall short of our needs. Remedying this 
situation requires action in a number of areas. Some. such 
as development of new weapons systems. will take a great 
deal of time. But other steps can pay off immediately. 

We need more ships, and ships take months if not 
years to build. But we also need to provide enough money 
for the ones we have to operate instead of limiting their 
steaming time by not providing enough fuel. 

The same situation exists with our planes. It is critical 
that we have a new bomber ready for action as quickly as 
possible. That can't happen in the next year. But we could 
increase our operating and maintenance budgets enough to 
make sure that all of the planes we do have are ready to 
fly — and that there is enough fuel to keep them in the air. 
The services do not have enough money now to do either. 

Our new commitments in the Indian Ocean-Persian 
Gulf area require still other steps in expanding our 
conventional forces. If we are to have a permanent naval 
presence in the Indian Ocean, and I am convinced we must, 
we must also have at least one additional carrier-battle 
group. Otherwise, we are left with our existing problem of 
robbing other areas of what were already barely adequate 
numbers of ships to meet long-standing commitments. 

We must increase our ability to move troops quickly. 
With our present equpment, we could move one Marine 
division to a world hot spot if we had to. But it would 
require pulling resources together from all over the world to 
do it. That isn't satisfactory. 

The list goes on. The needs I've outlined here are 
among the most critical initiatives. They are the minimum 
you should expect from sour leaders immediately. 

AUSTIN—In a surprise 
move that voters would 
probably like to see more of 
in state government, the 
State Board of Insurance 
commissioners last week 
..oted against a hike in auto 
,nsurancc rates. 

The insurance industry 
had requested Z rate hike 
that would raise consumer 
premiums by close to 100 
million in Texas. And since 
the state board staff had 
recommended a 5257 million 
increase. almost 19 percent. 
most observers thought the 
ndustry would conic away 
with some gains. 

But board chairman Wit-
ham P. Daves said the in-
dustry has enjoyed steady 
income increases from in-
vestments. and proposed to 
deny the rats increase. He 
was joined in the vote by 
Lyndon Olson Jr. and Dur-
wood Manford. 

Dave.' denial was shock 
enough for the industry rep-
resentatives attending the 
hearing. but chairman 
Oases, the former president 
of a bank and insurance 
company, had more to say. 

Using his own calcula-
tions. he argued companies 
have benefited from a steady 
increase in income from 
their investments, and that 
because of drastic inflation-
ary changes. a thorough re-
view should he made of the 
approach to the methods of 
insurance rate-making. 

Dave, recommended crea-
tion of an advisory commit. 
tee to study the subject of 
increased insurance company 
investment income. 

Gasoline Tax 

One of the toughest issues 
before the n-et Legislature 
will he reduction of local 
property taxes and finding 
other ways to raise revenue. 

Governor Clements and 
Lt. Gov. Bill Hobby have 
considered raising the five 
cents-per-gallon fuel tax. 
currently the lowest tax in 
the nation. but last week 
Hobby rejected a tax hike on 
motor foe's. 

He said he doesn't believe 
it will he needed because of 
unforeseen revenue increases 
in the sales tax and oil and 
gas severance taxes. 

Hobby may be reading 
the mood of taxpayers at the 
same time he is reading tax 
reports. Motor fuels are al-
ways subject to price in-
creases. especially at times of 
crises in the Mideast, and 
consumers are already angry 
enough at the rising cost. If 
the state were to add the 
burden of increased taxes, 
more than one political head 
would fall to outraged voters. 

Clements has yet to back 
off the idea, but some ob-
servers expect him to follow 
Hobby's example. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bernard 
Wolf spent three days of last 
week visiting children and 
grandchildren out of town. 
From Wednesday through 
Friday they were guests of 
their son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Kupper and family of 
Rockwall, and of a son and 
daughter-in-law Mr. and 
Mrs. Truman Wolf and 
family of Dallas. A gran-
dson, Scotty Wolf was 
hospitalized the day before 
in Richardson Hospital for 
treatment of his broken left 
leg, suffered in a football 
game. 

SLOW DOWN 

Controversial Pon 
A poll released last week 

showing President Jimmy 
Carter eight points ahead of 
Ronald Reagan in Texas has 
been praised, booed, respect-
ed and scoffed by many. 

Clements says Reagan 
own poll shows him leading 
Carter. The Carter folks say 
Reagan is dropping and the 
President is rising in theirs. 

Both candidates will visit 
Texas again before Novem-
ber, surely causing more THEY DEPEND ON YOU 

Reduction Blocked 
If consumers stand to gain 

on that from they stand to 
lose on another one 

In the same week, a state 
district judge blocked a 14 
percent reduction in credit 
life insurance rates granted 
by the board last March. 

Officials put the potential 
drop in rates to consumers at 
hetwcen $20 and 540 mil-
lion in Texas. 

But Judge Jim Dear ruled 
the insurance board violated 
the Administrative Proce-
dure Act last spring by not 
conducting the hearings as a 
"contested case." He also 
said the board lacked the au-
thority to regulate credit in-
surance commissions. The 21/2-Year 

Money Market Certificate 

Auto workers are unem-
ployed now, not because of 
Japanese imports but because 
of uneconomic and inflexible 
wage policies in the automobile 
industry. 

The 	only 	economic 
justification for wage increases 
is an increase in worker 
productivity. Yet for years 
while productivity has 
decreased year by year, wages 
have continued to increase year 
by year because of strong auto 
unions. 

A very high percentage of the 
cost of producing an 
automobile, as of everything, is 
labor cost. For years these 
increased labor costs have been 
passed along to be borne by the 
consumer in the form of higher 
prices. 

It is an economic fact of life 
that the higher prices are 
raised, the fewer buyers will be 
interested in a product. 

Can there be any logical 
reason why wages should in-
crease as sales are decreasing?. 
Yet this is precisely what has 
happened in the U. S. auto in-
dustry_ Auto workers' wages 
have increased year after year 
as sales of U.S.-produced 
vehicles have gone down, down. 
down. There is no question but 
this policy has helped price 
U.S.-made cars out of both 
domestic and foreign markets, 
and has contributed to the 
disastrous situation in the in-
dustry. 

It seems American business 
and labor leaders have failed to 
realize that prices are deter-
mined by consumers. not by 
businessmen. The American 
consumers have decided that 
prices of U.S.-made cars are too 
high, they are not competitive 
in many cases with imports. 
Sales are down: prices should 
be cut to the point where con-
sumers will begin to buy again. 
To accomplish this costs must 
be trimmed, including the 
largest cost of all — wages, or 
the entire industry will 
collapse, as has the T.V. in-
dustry. 10180 

Philonlum Leak? 
State Sen. A. R. Schwartz. 

0-Galveston, asked the State 
Health Department to look 
into reports of a plutonium 

What you should 
know about the 
energy-efficient 

heat pump. 
Current rate of 12.00% 

Central heat-
ing and air con-
ditioning sys-
tems don't last 
forever, So if you 
have to replace your present 
system, think about an energy. 
efficient heat pump. 

The heat pump is a single 
cooling and heating unit. In the 
summer, the heat pump is an ef 
ficient air conditioner and de-
livers cool air. In the winter, the 
heat pump switches and pro-
vides warm air, 

"the heat pump uses elcctri- 

    

  

 

city 	 ciently 
because it de-
livers about 
two units of 

   

heat for each 
unit of energy it uses during the 
heating season. Year-round the 
heat pump is the most efficient 
combination cooling and heat-
ing system available today. 

Consider the energy-saving 
facts and call Texas Power & 
Light for more information. 
We'd like to help you learn 
more about the energy-efficient 
heat pump. 

yields 12.94% 
Staying ahead financially 

has always been a race. But 
the 80's present new, tougher 
challenges. 

At First Texas Savings, 
we have ways to beat the 
80's. Like our 2'/z Year 
Money Market Certificate. 
It offers the guaranteed 
maximum rate, compounded 
daily, 365 days a year, for 
maximum yields on amounts 
as small as $100. No bank 
can pay more. Rates for new 
certificates are set biweekly 
and are good for the 
entire term. 

Sure, our 21/2-Year 
Money Market Certificate is a 
good investment, but it's also 
a no-risk investment. Your 
money is insured up to 
$100,000 by a federal 

agency and secured by First 
Texas' over 1.6 billion dollars 
in assets. 

Best of all, at First Texas, 
all or part of your money is 
available anytime, or you can 
borrow against it. Penalty 
on early withdrawal is six 
months' interest** and only on 
the amount withdrawn. 

So, before you put your 
money anywhere, remember: 
Others may keep you even in 
the 80's, but First Texas 
Savings will keep you ahead. 

Effective October 2 through October 15, 1980. 

Mnual weld reflects interest earned on principal 
and accumulated interest for a full year 
t•Recent federal regulations require principal re• 

dumon if sufficient interest does not exist 

Over 60 Offices Statewide. 
North Texas Region 
Bowie Office: 
609 Lindsey St 
872.5475 
Denison Office 
630 W. Main Si 
463-3702 
Gainesville Office 
101 E. Broadway 
665.3484 
Muenster Office: 
510 E. Division St 
759-2283 
Sherman Office - 
400 N. Travis St 
893-8191 

EXAS 
TEXAS POWER & LIG/ IT COMPANY 

A lax -paying, investor-owned electric utility 

Savings Association 

We have ways to beat 
the 80's. 
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IDEAS HAVE 
CONSEQUENCES 

It appears to be very difficult 
for Americans to realize the 
relationship between ideas and 
consequences. For example, 
the ideas which resulted in 
granting inordinate power to 
organized labor through biased 
legislation have finally brought 
forth the inevitable con-
sel.hueenccs. 

news stories of the day 
carry a report of unemployed 
auto workers pitching tents 
across from their idle factories 
in Michigan. They are at-
tempting to demonstrate that 
they may lose their homes if 
they don't get their jobs back 
soon, 

These are workers who have 
been laid off by a Ford Motor 
Company plant which produces 
Lincoln Continental and Con-
tinental Mark V luxury 
automobiles. 

The message lies in their 
statements blaming the 
Japanese for the less of their 
jobs. We can understand and 
sympathize with their plight 
and their reaction as unreal as 
it may be. People who buy 
luxury cars are not primarily 
interested in mileage, they are 
interested in luxury, comfort 
and prestige. Japanese imports 
do not provide these 
prerequisites. 

The sales of luxury vehicles 
are down for the very same 
reason the sales of all U.S 
produced cars are down, the 
prices are too high The luxury 
cars now being produced by the 
Michigan demonstrators are 
priced in the 015,000 to $20,000 
range Even mid-sized autos 
designed for the average wage-
earner are in the SP, ,k0 
CI rangn 

Lose Weight 
Safely 

with Der A Olot T•blois 
Only 98' at 

WATTS BROTHERS 



Electrical 
Contracting 

Fixtures 
Supplies 

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 

Installations, Repairs 

Call 665-2721 

Nights Call 
665-3263 or 665-4456 

Parker Electric 
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville 

1001 

Now's the best time to buy 

Sperry New Holland balers, 

hay tools and windrowers. You 

can receive a cash dividend of up 

to $1,500—or get Free Finance until the sea-

sonal use date—it's your choice. 

Free Finance means you can get the ma-
chines you want now, while equipment is 

available, and not pay any finance charges 

until their seasonal use date. A great way to 

insure you get the tools you 

need for next spring, and en-
joy tax benefits this year. 

Dollar Dividends give you up to $1,500 cash 

when you purchase and pay for eligible new 

machines. The size of your dividend depends 

on the model you buy, and how soon you buy 

it. Check this list for the models you need and 

the dividends you'll get. 

The sooner you buy—the larger your dividend check. 

ELIGIBLE MACHINES 
	

Said 

Bale Wagons (Models 1068. 	51.500 
1069, 10751 

Model 1425 Balers 	 S1.000 
SP Windrowers (Models 1100 

14001 
Model 1495 Haybine Mower-

Conchhouer 

Bale Wagons (Models 1038, 	S 700 S 650 S 600 S 550 
10631 

Balers (Models 420. 425, 430) S 650 	S 575 S 500 	S 425 

Round Balers (Models 851, 	S 600 	5 550 S 500 S 450 
852) 

Model 500 Baler 

Purchases made using Free Finance do not quality for a 
dollar dividend However equipment bought on the reg- 
ular New Holland Purchase Plan receives the dividend 

ELIGIBLE MACHINES 

Mower-Condihoner (Model 
4951 114 PT Windrower 

Model 846 Round Balers 
Bale Wagons (1036. 1037) 

Balers (Models 310. 315, 3201 
Models 488 and 489 Mower-

Conditioners 

Mower-Condilioners (Models 
472 474) 

Model 1002 Bale Wagon 
Model 1052 Slack Reinevet 

Bale Throwers, Model 90 Bale 
Handlers 

Rakes 
Mowers (Models 451. 456) 

DOLLAR DIVIDEND 

Sept 	Oct 	Nov.Dec 

600 S 550 S 500 S 450 

S 500 450 S 400 S 350 

S 400 S 350 S 300 S 250 

S 350 5 300 5 250 S 200 

S 300 5 275 S 250 S 225 

S 100 5 90 S 80 S 70 

DOLLAR DIVIDEND 

Oct 	Nov 

S1,400 	51,300 

S 900 5 BOO 

Oec 

51.100 

S 700 

MITCHELL AND CLOWER INC. 
E. Hwy. 82, GAINESVILLE, TX. 76240 

817-665-0789, 817-665-3921 

57ErTRY-1--JrL- NEW HOLLAND. 
Stop in and gel all the details 

Chames fine Quality Upholstery 
1122 S. Grand Ave., Gainesville, 665-3635 

Custom Made Draperies 
and Bedspreads 

Woven Woods and I Inch Fienalum 

Decor Blinds 
I blest Quality Upholstery Materials 

and Workmanship 

"Quality" IS the Difference 
Precision Scissors Sharpening 

4 

A diabetic clinic sponsor-
ed by Muenster Memorial 
Hospital in its conference 
room on September 26 was a 
rewarding experience to per-
sonnel of the hospital and 
about a dozen visitors from 
Muenster, Saint Jo, Mon-
tague, Nocona and Caps 
Corner. 

Save Money! 
Save Time! 

Prescription in our 

Middle Name. 

Shop the 
Drive-in Window 

for all your prescriptions 

and drug needs. 	1.001 
W A ITS 

Prescription Shop 

The program featured a 
talk by Dr. Elan Leevy of 
Dallas, consulting dietatian 
for Muenster Hospital, plus 
films, and literature relating 
to diabetics and special diets 
for them. In addition Joan 
Walterscheid demonstrated 
for dextrometer, a new piece 
of equipment used at the 
hospital for doing a blood 
sugar determination on a 
patient in 1 minute. 

A question and answer 
period followed, as well as 
an exchange of diabetic 
recipes and discussion of 
problems related to 
diabetes. 

Diabetes Update '80 

Joan Walterscheid, head 
nurse of Muenster Memorial 
Hospital, represented the 
hospital last Saturday at 
Diabetes Update, 1980, 
sponsored by North Texas 
Affiliate of the American 
Diabetes Association at 
Camp Sweeney. The full day 
program was a detailed 
presentation on diabetes, its 
current methods of treat-
ment and research progress 
for primary health care in 
professional and clinical 
establishments. 

Hood Club 
Plans Year 

Participation in the an-
nual "Christmas in Novem-
ber" project and planning 
programs and yearbook for 
1980-81 were the principal 
items of business, for mem-
bers of the Hood Extension 
Homemakers Club. 
Hostesses were Lanita 
Lewter and Johnnye Lewter. 
The meeting was held in the 
Hood Club Building on 
Wednesday, September 17 
at 1:30 p.m. The next 
meeting will be on October 
15 with a program on 
"Quilting." Mrs. Raymond 
(Magdaline) Zimmerer will 
be hostess in the Hood Club 
Building. 

Lindsay Jaycees 
Have Oktoberfest 

Jaycees of Lindsay will 
sponsor their seventh annual 
Oktoberfest next Sunday, 
Oct 5, noon to midnight in 
the Lindsay park. 

Along with an abundance 
of beer, German food and 
polka music, the event will 
feature a horseshoe tour-
nament and a 9 mile Kraut 
Run. Also prizes will be 
awarded for the best Ger-
man costume and the 
longest distance traveled by 
a visitor. 

Hospital Sponsors 
Diabetes Clinic 

N 

Library Receives 
8 Museum Books 

Muenster Public Library 
is one of over 300 public and 
school libraries in the state 
chosen to receive a gift of 
eight books from the Amon 
Carter Museum in Fort 
Worth. 

The gifts were made 
possible by a grant from a 
private Dallas foundation. 
The Museum undertook a 
similar program in the mid-
70s under a grant from the 
Texas Commission on the 
Arts and Humanities. 

Officials for the Museum 
said that they were pleased 
to be able to share the 
programs of the Museum, as 
represented by the books, 
with such a large number of 
libraries. 

The books cover a wide 
range of American art, 
history, and photography. 

All chronicle exhibitions 
that appeared at the 
Museum and other in-
stitutions throughout the 
country. The Amon Carter 
Museum opened in 1961 and 
is devoted to the "West-
ering" of America. It has 
published over 70 books in 
its twenty-year history. 

The books given to the 
library are: The Bison in Art 
by Larry Barsness, Cities on 
Stone by John Reps, 
Dorothea Lange Looks at 
the American Country 
Woman, The Track Going 
Back, The Democratic Art 

by Peter Marzio, American 
Art from the Worcester An 
Museum, American Im-
pressionist and Realist Pain-
tings from the William Mar-
shall Fuller Collection, and 
Todd Webb Photographs. 

IL 

KIRBY 
Vacuum Cleaners 

SINGER 
Sewing Machines 

SALES & SERVICE 

OPEN 
AT 328 E. California 

Gainesville 665-9812 
Across from the Post Office 

an,D. 
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SZCGOZOZOCCGOOCCOZGO' .......... 

Famous FAMOLARE®  

FALL SALE 

25%off 
Entire Stock Included 

Sale ends Saturday 

Visa - Master Card - Lay Away 

6 Month Yields UpTo 

11.85% 
To Maturity 

United States 
Government 

Agency Bonds 

State and Local IncomeTax Free 
Issued by Federal Farm Credit Banks 

6 MONTH YIELDS 

	

$ 5,000 
	

10.82 % 
	

To Maturity 

	

$ 10,000 
	

11.35% 
	

To Maturity 

	

$ 20,000 
	

11.64% 
	

To Maturity 

	

50,000 
	

11.79% 
	

To Maturity 

	

$100,000 
	

11.85% 
	

To Maturity 

05,000 minimum and multiples of 05.000 

Call Your Local E D. Jones Representative Today. 

Edward D. Jones & Co. 

KENNETH C. FLOYD 
First State Bank Building, Suite 305 
817.665-0351 Gainesville, Tx. 76240 

Thirty one CCD teachers 
and their aides of Sacred 
Heart Parish were com-
missioned as Catechetical 
Ministers in a religious 
ceremony preceding the 
CCD Mass on Wednesday 
evening, September 24, of-
ficiated by Father Stephen 
Eckart. 

Theme of the special 
liturgy was: "Parish Com-
munity - Servant of the 
Word." The ceremony 
began with the entrance 
procession led by Wayne 
Klement, carrying the ban-
ner and Dave Flusche 
carrying the Paschal Candle. 
Following them were the 
teachers and aides, CCD 
Commission members, Mass 
servers and Father Stephen. 

John Pagel Heads 
City Park Board 
John Pagel was elected 

president of the Muenster 
Park Board at its regular 
meeting Tuesday night in the 
City Hall. Others elected 
were Jack Flusche, vice-
president, and Edgar Dyer, 
secretary. Also on the board 
are Claude Klement and 
1. W. Fisher. 

In other business the 
board approved a request 
from Muenster Jaycees to 
drill a shallow water well in 
the park for watering 
vegetation... to relieve 
demand on the city's regular 
water system in case of 
another drought. 

Also, the park board, as 
custodian of the Muenster 
Youth Program's finances, 
approved a request for 5360 
by the local cub scouts. 

Two Qualify 
For Honor Roll 

Gina 	Felderhoff and 
Bruce Fuhrmann have been 
named on the Dean's Honor 
Roll of Texas Tech Univer-
sity for the summer session. 
They are among more than 
2300 students listed on the 
honor rolls in the six colleges 
of the university, with a 
total enrollment over 
23,000. Gina is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 
Felderhoff and Bruce is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Val 
Fuhrmann. 

Unfinished 
Furniture 

Choice of 18 roll top 
desks including 4 oak 

desks plus other 
unfinished furniture 

Allmann's 
Furniture 

1321 N. Grand 
Gainesville 

4.6.501 

Irene Hartman gave the 
first Reading; Pam Fette 
responded with the Psalm; 
and Dorothy Fisher gave the 
second Reading. 

Father Stephen conducted 
the Commissioning Rite, af-
ter the Call by Jerry Walter-
scheid, commentator. 
Responding to the Call were 
Mrs. Johnny (Jo Ann) 
Pagel, and Mrs. Dale 
(Charlotte) Klement, kin-
dergarten; Miss Kathy 
Fisher and Miss Lisa 
Trubenbach, 1st grade A; 
Mrs. Kenneth (Mary) 
Klement and Mrs. Henry 
(Doris) Crewing Jr. and 
Miss Connie Pierce, 1st 
grade B; Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde (Sharon) Walter-
scheid and Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry (Kathy) Vogel 2nd 
grade; Mrs. Bill (Rose) 
Black and Mrs. Maurus 
(Lynn) Hacker 3rd grade; 
Mrs. Mike (Betty) Kleiss and 
Mrs. Wylie (Helen) Lewis, 
4th grade A; Mrs. Paul 
(Dorothy) Fisher and Mrs. 
Wayne (Doris) Klement, 4th 
grade B; Mrs. Richard (Kay) 
Pagel and Mrs. Harold (Bet-
ty) Bindel, 5th grade; Mrs. 
Jimmy Jack (Colette) Biffle, 
Miss Judy Walterscheid, 
Miss Linda Grewing and 

Mr. Mike Kleiss, 6th grade; 
Mrs. 	James 	(Theresa) 
Walterscheid and Mrs. 
Henry (Betty) Felderhoff, 
7th grade A; Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny (Louise) Fisher 7th 
grade B; Mrs. Roy (Irene) 
Hartman and Mrs. Albert 
(Imogene) Zimmerer, 8th 
grade; Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
(Janet) Hess, 9th grade: 
Adam Wolf, loth grade; 
Mrs. Edmund (Maryann) 
Fleitman, 11th grade; Mrs. 
David (Pam) Fette, 12th 
grade. 

All teachers and aides 
were grouped around the 
altar. Each Catechist was 
given a candle lighted from 
the Paschal Candle by 
Commission members 
Wayne Klement and Dave 
Flusche. 

To conclude the rite, the 
group prayed "Mary's Can-
ticle" together and returned 
to their pews for the 
remainder of the Mass. 

Offertory petitions were 
given by Ronnie Hess and 
Offertory gifts were brought 
to the altar by Johnny and 
Louise Fisher and Kay 
Pagel. 

Mass servers were Donnie 
Boydstun, Greg Hoenig, 
Eric Dankesreiter, Douglas 
Evans and Shawn Flusche. 
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Neu - Sandman!' Engagement 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Neu of Rt. 2 Gainesville have 

announced the engagement and approaching marriage of 
their daughter, Marilyn to Leslie Sandmann, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Julius Sandmann also of Rt. 2 Gainesville. The 
couple has set November 8 for their wedding dale. Msgr. 
Hubert J. Neu uncle of the bride-elect will officiate in St. 
Peter's Church of Lindsay at a 5 p.m. Nuptial Mass. Miss 
Neu is a graduate of Lindsay High and Cooke County 
College's Cosmethology Class and is employed at Toot's 
Cut and Curl in Lindsay. The future groom is also a Lin-
dsay High graduate and is employed at Valenite. They 
will reside on Route 2, Gainesville. 

NEW 
AT Daniel Boone's 

Dresses, Pant Suits, 

Blouses, Smocks, 

Sheet Sets, Towels, 

Wash Cloths, 
Nurse Uniforms 

Large Selection 

Ladies' & Men's Sweaters 

Priced too low to advertise 

All Twin and Queen 

Bedspreads 50% off 
Children's 

Ski or Snow Suits 

50% OFF 
Values to $30, Little tioy ,  

3 pc. Dress Suits 	 5400 

Daniel Boone 
VISA 
	

Discount 
Saint Jo, 995 2103 

MRS. JIM KOELZER 

Mathews Photographers 

SALE 
Just in time for cold weather! 

Thur.,Fri.,Sat.& Sun. 
October 2-4, Open 8 a.m.-10 p.m. 

Sunday Oct. 5, Open 2 p.m.-5 p.m. 

IN STOCK 
r Stainless Steel Insulated Flu 
r Heavy duty black stove pipe 

Wall and floor protection 

--- Fireplace Inserts 
Along with our fine stoves 

Shop while 

selection is good 

Heffley's Wood Heaters 
Noah Heffley Jr. 

West of Collinsville off FM 3164 

and FM 902 - Follow Signs 
214-429-6262 or 214-564-3833 

	
46101 

sitlek.._ LIMITED OFFER! D IRECT TO YOU FROM HOTPOINT! 

+113.1-t_p_0111± 

DELUXE 19 CU FT 
REFREINGEERRGA TY 0-SRAVF RI NEGE z E R  

❑ Uses just 89 kw hours 
per month' with energy- 
saver switch in normal 

EPcrift 'l 'ennt loam insulation 
❑ 19.0 Cu. II. no-frost 

refrigerator-freezer 
❑ 13.8 Cu ft fresh foo 

capacity 
'1 5 2 Cu ft freezer section. 

Reversible doors 
13 Rugged TM., 

and cabinet I. 
O See-thru me,' ' 

CASH 
FACTORY 
REBATE! 

CASH FACTORY 
REBATE! 

030 

now just... '409 

Wash*, '4',  

A 

DAP,  
Salt 

ati LE12580A 

now $op 
HOTPOINT REBATE SOO just... I 

Otis Furniture 
115  South Commerce, Gainesville, 665.6861 

Offer applies W all retail purchases Oct I IN, Nov 30 1980 on selected Hotpoint quality appliances shot, 

Coat Sale 

0 20°/ 
Discount on all 

At ' 	coats in stock 

Friday and Saturday 
ONLY 

Oct 3rd and 4th 
Boys 

Hamric's 
Men's and Boys' Wear 

"The place to go for brands you know" 
203 N. Mein, Muenster, 759-4144 	■ tl 

li  2
size s 
ioe20 and Men 3s izes 50  

Keepsake Pak 

Preserves and 

Protects 

the original beauty 

of your wedding 

gown or other 
treasures 

Miller 
Cleaners 

309 N. Commerce 
665-3201, Gainesville 

ae X01 
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	Lifestyle 	 
Carol Grewing Marries Jim Koelzer 

Homemakers Greet 
New Members 

Carol Lee Grewing bec-
ame the bride of Jim Koelzer 
in a Nuptial Mass with 
double ring ceremony in 
Sacred Heart Church on 
Saturday, September 27. 
Father Stephen Eckart of-
ficiated at 5 p.m. 

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Grewing, Jr. of Rt. 4, 
Gainesville and Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Koelzer, Sr. of 
Muenster, The bride is a 
graduate of Era High 
School, attends Cooke 
County College and is em-
ployed by W.J. Luke Com-
pany. The groom is a 
graduate of Muenster High 
School and is employed by 
Felderhoff Bros. Drilling 
Co. 

Their vows were ex-
changed before an altar 
decorated with arrangemen-
ts of gladioli, carnations, 
gypsophila and Fuji mums, 
with lighted candles in tall 
holders. A pair of tall floor 
candelabra each held an 
ascending spiral of lighted 
candles, entwined with 
greenery and gladioli and 
MUMS. 

The bride was presented 
at the altar by her father. 
She wore a formal white 
wedding gown of silk organ- 
za. The bodice, 	with 
scalloped 	sweetheart 
neckline, was overlaid with 
Venise lace. Long full sheer 
sleeves were gathered to 
matching lace cuffs. The 
skirt, attached to the high 
waistline, was designed of 
elegant crystal pleating and 
extended to a chapel train. 

Her picture hat was of 
matching lace, with a three-
quarter length veil attached 
in back. Her all-white bridal 
bouquet was of cascading 
roses and stephanotis 
surrounding a white orchid. 
A crystal and silver rosary -
a graduation gift from her 
god-mother, Mrs. Frank 
Beyer, was entwined in the 
flowers. In keeping with 
tradition, she carried a lace 
handkerchief given by her 
maternal grandmother, Mrs. 
Albert Reiter, and borrowed 
an opal ring from her sister, 
Kathy Barton, and had a 
penny in her shoe. 

For sentiment, she presen-
ted a red rose to her mother, 
to the groom's mother and 
placed a similar rose in 
tribute on the Blessed 
Virgin's altar during the 
ceremony. Following the 
rcitation of their vows, the 
couple lit their Unity candle 
on the altar. 

Attendants 
Mrs. Kathy Barton of 

Gainesville was her sister's 
matron of honor; Mrs. 
Terry Gilbreath of Denton, 
another sister was 
bridesmatron; Robin 
Walterscheid, bride's cousin 
of Muenster was 
bridesmaid; Molly Koelzer 
of Muenster, groom's sister 
was junior bridesmaid and 

Kay Grewing of Gainesville, 
bride's sister was flower girl. 

The honor attendants 
wore identical dresses of 
dusty rose Quiana, designed 
with draped bodice, empire 
waistline, and crystal 
pleated skirt, and matching 
fingertip length shoulder 
capes of chiffon. They 
carried bouquets of pink 
carnations and yellow 
daisies. 

The flower girl and junior 
bridesmaid wore dresses of 
rose and gray floral Batiste, 
with puffed sleeves and pink 
satin ribbon tie at the empire 

waist. 
Earl Koelzer, Jr. of 

Muenster, groom's brother, 
Gary Grewing of 
Gainesville, bride's brother 
and Mike Davidson of 
Muenster were groomsmen. 

Mike Grewing of Muen-
ster and Troy Grewing of 
Gainesville, both brothers of 
the bride, Danny Yosten of 
Dallas, groom's brother-in-
law and Steve Haverkartip, 
groom's cousin were ushers. 

Mrs. John Alexander 
organist and Karen House 
vocalist, both of Era, 
presented wedding music. 

Mrs. Beverly Yosten of 
Dallas, sister of the groom 
presented Scripture 
readings; and Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Beyer of Lindsay and 
Mr. and Mrs. Alvin "Red" 
Loerwald of Gainesville, 
god-parents of the bride and 
groom, presented Offertory 
gifts. 

Reception 
A reception, dinner and 

dance followed in the Sacred 
Heart Community Center, 
hosted by parents of the 
bride and groom. 

Marlyn 	Koelzer 	of 
Gainesville, sister-in-law of 
the groom and Connie Pier-
ce of Gainesville, friend of 
the bride were at the bride's 
book. Judy Walterscheid 
and Jill Walterscheid, Sheila 
Haverkamp and Julie 
Dankesreiter, cousins of the 
bride and groom, and Betty 
Rose Walterscheid were 
reception assistants. 

The bride's table held a 
centerpiece of two doves 
surrounded by flowers and 
white wedding bells with 
flower streamers. Guest 
tables were decorated with 
dusty rose ribbon and fans 
in pink, burgundy and grey. 

The three tiered white 
wedding cake, trimmed in 
pink, stood over a lighted 
fountain and the groom's 
chocolate cake were placed 
on a separate table, on a lace 
cloth. The table held two 
arrangements of pink, 
burgundy and white car-
nations. A wall banner of 
crocheted lace was lettered 
in rose. 

When the couple returns 
from a trip to New Orleans, 
they will be at home in 
Muenster. 

The rehearsal dinner was 
held at The Center, hosted 
by the groom's parents on 
Thursday evening, for the 
wedding party and their 
guests. 

A Recipe and Ingredient 
shower was given on Sep-
tember 14 in the T.P.&L. 
building, by four hostesses, 
Mrs. Janell Kupper of 

The Bluebonnet Extens-
ion Homemakers Club held 
a get-acquainted party for 
its new members last week 
Wednesday evening in the 
home of Mrs. Dolores Luke. 

Mrs. Gwen Trubenbach 
greeted guests and members 
as they arrived. Mrs. 
Marilyn 	Luke, 	club 
president, 	told 	about 
programs and activities for 
the coming year. Mmes. 
Judy McDaniel and Joyce 
Abney were in charge of in-
vitations and name tags. 

Each guest and member 
received a packet of 500 
bluebonnet seeds and a 
brochure of "Flowers of 
Texas." They were asked to 
plant bluebonnets in their 
own yards. Dolores Luke is 
in charge of a beautification 
project to plant the State 

125 at Reunion of 
Bindel Relations 
More than 125 descend-

ants of the late Mr. and Mrs. 
Peter Bindel were in reunion 
Sunday. Originally planned 
for the pavilion of the City 
Park, the gathering was 
moved to the Knights of 
Columbus Hall by the 
drought-breaking rain. 

Attending the noon 
covered dish meal and an of 
ternoon of visiting were 
relatives from Wichita Falls, 
Windthorst, Pilot Point, 
Lewisville, Farmers Branch, 
and Cooke County. 

Most of the guests 
remained until about 5 p.m. 

Mrs. Gobble Entertains 

Guests From California 
Guests of Mrs. Clive 

Gobble of Muenster and 
Mr. Gobble of St. Richard's 
Villa for a week were her son 
and daughter-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Glenn Cathey of 
Norwalk, California and 
their daughter and family, 
Iris and Edward Vallier and 
16 month old Stephanie, all 
of Westminister, California. 

They also visited Mrs. 
Cathey's mother, Mrs. Mar-
tin Friske in Gainesville, her 
sisters and families, the 
Alvin Fuhrmans of Muen-
ster and the Bernard San-
dmanns of Howe. Mrs. 
Glenn Cathey is the former 
Myrtle Friske, a Muenster 
native. 

All the group was together 
for Sunday dinner in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Gobble and Michael. 

Before arriving here on 
September 20, the Califor-
nians visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Pat Cathey in Antelope, 
Texas. 

Needed! Old Uniforms! 
Used Blue Bird jumpers 

and blouses are needed by 
new members. Anyone 
having some to share may 
phone Peggy Walter 759-
4410 or Shirley Knabe 759-
2888. 

Valley View, Mrs. Jeanette 
Reiter, Mrs. Margie Walter-
scheid and Robin Walter-
scheid all of Muenster. 

A bachelorette party was 
given by Mrs. Sharon Wolf, 
Mrs. Janet Voth and Mrs. 
Bill Luke at the Wolf home 
on September 19. 

Flower at several locations 
along Hwy 82 in Muenster. 

The party featured a 
sharing of favorite dessert 
recipes, and an attractive 
dessert table, centered by an 
arrangement of silk 
bluebonnets which will be 
saved for use at other club 
activities. 

Mrs. Michelle Knauf ser-
ved hot punch or coffee 
from a silver service. Mem-
bers who shared recipes, and 
the desserts they brought to 
the party included: Ann 
Perkins - English Toffee 
Bars and Jelly Jewels; Betty 
Rose Walterscheid - Hermit 
Cake; Kathy Herres - Cheese 
Bars; Jo Ann Pagel -
Banana Cake; Charlotte 
Klement - Cherry Coconut 
Bars; Monica Hess - Apricot 
Dream Bars; Marilyn Luke -
Applesauce Cake; and 
Michelle Knauf - Hot Spiced 
Tea. 

The next meeting will be 
held on Monday October 20, 
instead of the regular 2nd 
Tuesday, to avoid conflict 
with the Texas Extension 
Homemakers Association 
Convention in San Antonio. 
Monica Hess will be the 
delegate and several other 
members may be able to at-
tend, also. 
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Plant NOW for Early 

Spring Bloom! 

Winterize your lawns with 

our A&M recommended 

Fertilizer Blend 

50 LB. Bag Reg. $ 8.95 

Rye Grass 
Reg. 35 c per LB. 

Now only 

Fall bulbs 
Crocus, Hyacinths, Tulips, 
Daffodils, Grape Hyacinths, 

Peonies 

Fall bedding plants 
Mums, Pansies, Dianthus, 
Carnations, Daisies, 

Snap Dragons 

•■••••••• 

Its going to be a 

Cold and Rainy 
Winter 

• • • so come 

to the 

'Commerce Street Store 

for all your foul 
weather clothing. 

Commerce Street Store 
Pete Briscoe, Gainesville 

• •■■•■ •• •■ ••••••••• ■•• 

Hwy 82, Gelneayllle. 	“"'" 

2 miles west of 1.35 	''tie to.  

We sell the best and service the rest. 
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The best trips 
start with us. 

We'll help you enjoy it more. 

You see, our job is to help you plan your vacation. Make all the 

arrangements. Handle all the details. 

And since it's our place to know all about any place you might 
consider, we know precisely what details and arrangements must 

be handled and made. 

Best of all, we don't charge you anything for your assistance. 

Of course, you could do everything we do yourself. 

But that would only leave you back where you started 
Tired. And ready for a nice vacation. 

A&A Travelworld 
121 North Grand Avenue 

Gainesville, Texas 
665-4181 	 665-1794 

	
44.301 

Nurses Shoes 

50% 

All 
Sizes 

The Shoe Shope 
305 E. California, Downtown Gainesvi e 

NO PAYMENTS 
toMAR. 1,1981 

On new Ford farm tractors!' 
Morel your chance- 10 Oct4 ! the nets I .nd tractor you need 

no,. v. nh no payments until nest Sprung' 

Bus any ness Ford tractor 12 PTO h or,eposser or 

larger. v. ith a quality Inc do, n pas [nem or trade-in. and 
pas no Finance charges or other payment. until March I. 
1981 

Ask about matching implements, too! This offer 
also applies to any snatching Ford implement 
purchased with your new Ford tractor 

This offer expires October 31,1980. 
.00er 110P9 not .3;30 ro gore , nmenral mn conres.on, new ms, num s.1 ,e• 
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Rosston Area News by Ruth Smith 
Forestburg News 

Myrt Denham is ill this 
week. Therefore her Forest-
burg news notes have not 
arrived, but will re-appear 
next week. We hope she will 
be feeling better soon. 

Hospital Notes 
The following patients 

were dismissed during the 
past week at Muenster 
Memorial Hospital. 

Tuesday, Sept. 23: A.T. 
Dickerson, Muenster; Mark 
Rankin, 	Bowie; 	Milton 
Rivoire, Gainesville. 

Wednesday, Sept. 24: 
Mrs. Mary Koester, Muen-
ster; Laura Slinger, Coman-
che; 	James 	Jaroscak, 
Gainesville; 	Mrs. 	Bob 
Richards, Santos. 

Thursday, 	Sept. 	25: 
Harold Bratz, Carrollton; 
Tony Fenoglio, Montague; 
Robert Gayles, Forestburg. 

Friday, Sept. 26: Mrs. 
Charles Steed and baby girl, 
Gainesville; Mrs. Wake 
Morn, Nocona. 

Saturday, Sept 27: Mike 
Dangelmayr, 	Muenster; 
Mrs. Axilda Butts, 
Gainesville; Mrs. Mildred 
Biffle, Lindsay; Mrs. Ralph 
Neely, Dallas. 

Sunday, Sept. 28: Morris 
Williams, Valley View. 

Monday, Sept. 29: Leslie 
Hammer, Gainesville; Mrs. 
Elizabeth Gilstrap, Nocona; 
Mrs. Charles Lewis and 
baby boy, Nocona. 

Miss Deeann Roach has 
enrolled in Cooke County 
Junior College for the fall 
semester where she is taking 
the basic courses. Deeann is 
a graduate of Era High 
School, and she tells us that 
the Era Hornets will be hosts 
to the Fort Worth Masonic 
Home Friday night October 
3, at Era, and that Era will 
have their bonfire Thursday 
night October 2 at 8 o'clock. 
Deeann is now the reigning 
queen and will place her 
crown on the new queen 
Friday night at the 
homecoming. Kyle Taylor 
was her escort. 

- -- 
There will be surprise card 

shower and birthday party 
for Mrs. Susie Prather 
Thursday, October 2, at her 
home. All her relatives and 
friends are invited to come. 

- -- 
Guests of Mr. and Mrs. 

H.D. Cooke were her 
nephew Mr. and Mrs. Doug 
Thompson and their new 
baby daughter Meredith, of 
Fort Worth. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Hebert 

Richardson and son Bob left 
Saturday September 27 to 
visit her parents in Bluff 
Dale. 

- -- 
Mrs. Patsy Bell was 

dismissed from Westgate 
Hospital Tuesday, she is  

recovering from surgery. 
--- 

Brad Roach is on a weeks 
vacation from Webber Air-
craft, so Brad is taking a lit-
tle trip on the Gulf Coast, he 
has been to Houston, San 
Marcus, .Port Aransas, and 
other points of interest. 

- -- 
Miss Norma Jean Richar-

dson and Miss Becky Fields 
spent the weekend in 
Galveston. 

--- 
James Penton of Gainesville 
spent Sunday and had lunch 
with his parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Penton. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Britian 

visited Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Britian Saturday. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Norris Dill 

of Gainesville spent Sunday 
and had lunch with his 
mother Mrs. Bobbie Dill 
September 21. 

- -- 
Miss Sissie Kelly spent 

Saturday night with her 
grandmother Mrs. Estelle 
Kelly. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. C.W. Mar-

tin visited her sister Mrs. 
Lela Martin in Gainesville 
Friday September 26, Mr. 
and Mrs. C.A. Knight were 
also visitors of Lela, they all 
had lunch together. 

--- 
Mrs. Maurene Griggs left 

by bus to spend a week with 
her mother Mrs. Maurene 
Boothe in Gonzalez, on 
Friday her husband Rube 
drove down and Saturday 
night they attended a 1940 
graduating class reunion of 
the Gonzalez High School. 
Some of the class hadn't 
seen one another for forty 
years. 

- -- 
Ricky Balthroup injuried 

his hand at work when it got 
caught in a meat grinder, 
Ricky is employed at 
Fischer's in Muenster. 

- -- 
The Community Club will 

hold its regular meeting 
Wednesday October 1, at 
the community center, the 
E.M.S. will give the 
program. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Webb 

of Dallas spent Friday night 
with his aunt Mrs. Opal 
Berry. --- 

Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Barr 
visited Mr. and Mrs. George 
Berry Thursday evening 
September 25. 

All Trees 

Mrs. Stewart Hughes left 
by car Sunday 28 at 12 
o'clock September 28 for 
her home in St. Louis, she 
arrived at her neices' home 
Dr. and Mrs. Mike Taylor, 
Terri and Jonie in Tulsa at 4 
p.m. to spend the night, 
then drive on in to St. Louis. 
She had been visiting her 
mother Mrs. Vena Settle. 

- -- 
Mrs. Mary Lou Edwards, 

and her children Sharon, 
Lisa, Charles and his friend 
Jimmy of Sunset had lunch 
Sunday September 21 with 
her parents Mr. and Mrs. 
C.W. Martin. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Allen 

Britian and Jason visited his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. John-
ny Britian Sunday after-
noon. 

- -- 
Mrs. R.A. Busby and her 

neice Pat and children of 
Dallas visited her father 
Tom Inglish Saturday, they 
all had lunch in St. Jo, then 
all drove over to Thacker-
ville, Oklahoma. 

- — 
Mr. and Mrs. Charley 

Haverkamp of Dallas spent 
Saturday with her father Joe 
Frank Berry and gran-
dparents Mr. and Mrs. 
George Berry. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve 

Kohler, Jasica and Gavin 
were in Dallas the week end 
of September 20-21 to help 
Martha Van Ness celebrate 
her sixth birthday, Martha is 
the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Legare Van Ness. 

- -- 
We are happy to report 

that the Rosston area had 
lots of nice rain which we 
are very thankful for, some 
reporting 10 inches, to 71/2 
inches. 

--- 
The volley ball games 

were rained out during the 
week. 

- -- 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom 

Rosson of Era were Wed-
nesday night guests of her 
sister Mrs. Estelle Kelly. 

- -- 
Rev. and Mrs. 	AI 

Ellingburg and Donald took 
their daughter and sister to 
D.F.W.Airport Sunday Sep-
tember 28 to board a plane 
for Tulsa where Susan at-
tends Oral Roberts Univer-
sity, Susan had come to at-
tend the wedding of Miss 
Carol Grewing and Jim 
Koelzer Saturday night Sep-
tember 27. —_- 

Mrs. Wilma Richardson 
and Mrs. Louise Shults will 
visit Mrs. Flora Williams of 
Waco who is the house guest 
of Mrs. Laura Warren of 
Greenwood. 

- -- 
Mrs. Gladys Balthroup, 

Mrs. Wilma Richardson and 
Mrs. Jerry Balthroup atten-
ded the Bread Fair at the 
Gainesville Community 
Center Wednesday Septem-
ber 24. 

- -- 
Among those attending 

the wedding of Miss Carol 
Grewing and Jim Koelzer 
Saturday night September 
27 in Sacred Heart Church 
in Muenster were Mrs. 
Wilma Richardson, Miss 
Sheron Richardson, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.Y. Brandon and 
Stanley, Danny Richardson 
and Miss Clara Lusk of 
Gainesville. 

Jason and Melissa Biffle 
spent the weekend with their 
grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
Dan Richardson and family. 

Glen is Two 
Glen Joseph Dangelmayr 

celebrated being two years 
old on September 21 when 
his parents, Joe and Pam 
Dangelmayr entertained 
with a hamburger supper at 
their home. 

A circus animal cake, 
decorated by his mother, 
was also served with ice 
cream and punch. Gifts were 
opened, and pictures were 
made of the honoree and his 
guests. 

Helping Glen celebrate 
were his sister, Kelly Ann; 
his grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. Herman Stoffels and 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman 
Dangelmayr; his great uncle, 
Bishop A. Danglmayr; his 
god-parents Bill and 
Charlotte Dangelmayr and 
Shawn; aunts, uncles and 
cousins: Mrs. Betty Ann 
Trubenbach and Donna, 
Carl, Steve and Richard; 
Jim and Cindy Gehrig and 
Jason, Ryan and Michael; 
Rex and Donna Simmons 
and Russell and Chad; 
Chuck and June Bartush; 
and Craig, Connie and Sally 
Stoffels. 

Joey is Three 
Joseph Martin (Joey) son 

of Mr. and Mrs. Ernest 
Martin, celebrated his 3rd 
birthday twice. On Septem-
ber 21 he and his sister' 
Yvonne and their parents 
visited the Fort Worth Zoo 
and Amusement Park and 
then had lunch at Mc-
Donald's. Returning home 
the family enjoyed a birth-
day supper with his great-
grandmother, Mrs. Hattie 
Reid in Denton. 

On September 28, the 
Martins entertained a group 
of family members including 
the grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. Lavonne Reid and Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Martin. 
Also Mechal Reid, Estelle 
Martin and Steve Woods, 
Mr. and Mrs. Doug Martin 
and Pete and Russell, Mr. 
and Mrs. Phillip Russell and 
Angie and Greg, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Rusty Reid and 
Talisha. 

Refreshments 	of 
homemade ice cream and a 
cake decorated in the Duke's 
of Hazzard theme were ser-
ved Sunday afternoon. The 
honoree also received a 
phone call from his god-
mother, Irene Martin of 
Dallas. 

Starke Vacation 
Mrs. Joe Starke has 

returned from a two week 
vacation with her daughters, 
Mrs. L.L. Pfaff of Denver 
and Mrs. Ella Taylor of 
Lakewood, Colorado. She 
flew from Oklahoma City 
and returned the same way 
and then visited with a 
sister-in-law, Mrs. Margaret 
Schettler. On September 19, 
she went to Sterling, Okla. 
to visit two brothers, Bill 
Schettler and Albert Schet-
tler, who brought her home 
on September 22. 

Report your News 
to the 

ENTERPRISE 
759-4311 

Jennifer is Seven 
Jennifer Walter's seventh 

birthday, September 23, was 
observed during a party at 
McDonald's in Gainesville 
on September 27. 

Attending were Vickie 
Bayer. Misty Vogel, 
Cheramie Moster,Cindy Bar 
thold, Kristen Klement, Lisa 
Schilling, Jamie Flusche, 
Melody Wilde, Dana Hess, 
Julie Hess, all of Muenster 
and Cassandra Fuhrmann 
and Kim Hoberer of Lin-
dsay; also the honoree's 
brother and sister Michael 
and Michelle Walter and 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Chris Walter, who hosted 
the party. 

	

Refreshments 	included 
hamburgers, French fries, 
Cokes and a decorated bir-
thday cake. 

r 
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Fall 
Clearance Sale 
Lowest Prices Ever 
on Trees & Shrubs 

All 1 Gal. Shrubs 

$ 1 79  each 
Values to $4 99  

1/2 price 

Save up to $3000 

502 N. Main, Muenster 
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"You forgot 

the monthly 

report?" 

Bryan's 
Paint & Body Shop 

Bryan Sicking 
736.2295 

1 1/2 miles south 
of Myra 

.Quality work at reasonable rates ...Free estimates 

.Fast service on all auto glass ...thorough handling 
...Specializing in collision repair of Insurance 

All work covered by 1 year guarantee 	
claims 

toot 
	• 

Too frequently, an Insured loss occurs when 
the Insured has failed to renew, or has 
defaulted on the premium payment, and for-
feits the right to collect Insurance. Be sure to 
keep your insurance policies In force at all 

times. 

F M W 
Moenster SW. Bank Building 759 , 2257 INSURANCE AGENCY 

It's firewood time again 

Stihl it, 
with STIHL Chain Saws 

WE SELLTHE WORLD'S 
LARGEST SELLING CHAIN SAW. 

Stahl' drdn1 get to be 
the world's largest selling 
charn raw with a product 
that needs more serbae 
than a gives 

But t1 your Sehl saw men al the benne= e 
ever needs a tune up, 	 here to help. Come by 
maybe spark plug, or 	 and See the world's finest 
brat a °noes:not, the best chain saw Or come by for 
factory homed seoncoi 	 repairs on all the others 

WE FIX ALL THE OTHERS. 
Muenster Garden Center 

502 N. Main, 759.2766, Mon.-Sat. 8.5:30 

STIHL 
The naddilasseasi sellineshein sew 

413401 

St. Theresa of the Child 
Jesus was honored during 
the CCD Liturgy at the 
Wednesday evening Mass in 
Sacred Heart Church. The 
7th grade class of Mrs. 
James Walterscheid par-
ticipated. Among those 
taking part were Dana 
Dankesreiter with the first 
reading; Dolle Pagel with 
the responsorial psalm and 
Valarie Vogel with the 
petitions and prayers of the 
faithful. The following: 
Darren Walterscheid, Dickie 
Trubenbach, John Anderle 
and Scott Klement presented 
the Offertory gifts.- 

The Mass servers were 
Samuel Fleitman, Michael 
Pagel, Weldon Hermes, 
Chris Klement, Jon Fleit-
man and Buba Klement. 

lie aft. CAW Jars. .. 

DRIVE AND ARRIVE 
SAFELY 

TEXAS 1021WAT DEPAITIOR 

Restaurant & Tavern 
522 E. Division, Muenster 

Features Homemade 
Pizza, Choice Steaks 

and Seafood, 
a complete selection 

of Beer, Wine and 

Mixed Drinks. 
All this plus a New 
expanded Salad Bar 

Rest. 759.2910 Tavern 759-2984 
Kitchen closes at 10 p.m. Sun.•Thur., 

11 p.m. Fri. & Sat. 

CLOSED MONDAYS 
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SCHOOL NEWS 

National Honor 
Society 

National Honor Society 
officers for 1980.81 are 
Vance Wells, junior, 
president; John Zimmerer, 
senior, vice president; Rene 
Stelzer, junior, secretary-
treasurer; Tim Schneider, 
junior, reporter. 

The sponsors are Martha 
Koester and Patsy Sloan. 

Membership in the 
National Honor Society is 
one of the highest honors 
that can be earned by a high 
school 	student. 
Qualifications 	include 
scholarship, service, leader-
ship and character. A mem-
ber must have an average 
grade of no less than 85% 
and each member must be 
recommended by the 
faculty. 

Homemaking 
Classes 

Homemaking I, II, and 
III attended a style show 
Wednesday, October 1, 
sponsored by Chapman's of 
Gainesville. It was themed: 
"Building a Fall and Winter 
Wardrobe on a Budget." 

F.F.A. 
Two F.F.A. teams placed 

in the 1980 Upper-Elm-REd 
Soil Conservation Service 
District Plant identification 
contest on September 25. 

The contest includes three 
counties, Montague, Cooke, 
and Grayson. 

Contestants must first 
identify each plant and mark 
five to six characteristics on 
each. There are different 
grasses, legumes, forbs, and 
woody plants to judge.  

of Muenster 
Public 
School 

The Junior team consisted 
of freshmen Ag. I students; 
Craig Felderhoff, Bryan 
Klement, Steve Trubenbach, 
Stephen Vogel, Duane 
Walterscheid (ALT.). This 
group placed first in district. 
The Senior team consisted 
of two Ag. II students and 
two Ag. 111 students; Brad 
Biffle, Karl Trubenbach, 
Timmy Schneider, Dale 
Swirczynski. This team 
placed 3rd in district. Karl 
Trubenbach was 8th high 
individual. 

JETS 
The Junior Engineering 

Technical Society, JETS, of 
Muenster High School, held 
election of officers on Sep-
tember 23. 

Leading the chapter 
during 1980-81 are: Seniors, 
Glenn Fischer, president; 
Barbie Wimmer, vice 
president; John Zimmerer 
secretary; Judy Dittfurth, 
reporter; and Ricky Winn, 
parliamentarian. 

Students must be juniors 
or seniors in an advanced 
science or math course to 
qualify for membership in 
the JETS. 

Other JETS members are 
Larry Fleitman, senior; Ben-
ji Luke, senior; John 
Walterscheid, senior; 
Charlotte Fleitman, junior; 
Doug Walterscheid, junior; 
Kelly Nance, junior; and 
Vance Wells, junior. 

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 

301 E. Broadway 
665-3521. Gainesville 

If no answer call 
665.2452 	toot  

Scouts Work on 
Bus Repair Job 
All of the Muenster Boy 

Scouts of Troop 664 worked 
on their bus druing their 7 
p.m. meeting on September 
22. They are giving it a first 
class sanding job, 
preparatory to painting. 
After an hour or so, six of 
the older Scouts worked on 
requirements of the 
"Citizenship in the Nation" 
Merit Badge. 

At the September 29 
meeting, the combined 
membership discussed a 
Camporee, scheduled for 
later in the fall. The six older 
scouts then continued 
working on requirements of 
the "Citizenship in the 
Nation" Merit Badge. 

Lisa Hennigan and James 
Moster, students at Sacred 
Heart High School, will be 
among more than 100 high 
school students honored by 
Incarnate Word College on 
Thursday, October 2. It will 
be the third major event of 
the College's Centennial. 

Students selected as Cen-
tennial Junior Scholars were 
nominated by school prin-
cipals and rank highest in 
their class. 

The ceremony will begin 
at 7:30 p.m. The invocation 
will be given by Sister 
Margaret Patrice Slattery, 
president of Incarnate Work 

A&M archaeologists 
identify British ship 

COLLEGE 's I .kTION 
Texas A&M nautical ar-

chaeologists have discovered 
that a jumbled mass of 
scorched timber and metal was 
a British flagship from the Rev-
olutionary War Battle of York-
town. 

Archaeologist Richard Steffy, 
who is ship reconstructor for 
the Institute of Nautical Ar-

chaeology headquartered at 
Texas A&M, led nine graduate 
students in a project which 
confirmed a shipwreck in Vir-
ginia's York River was HMS 
Charon, flagship of Lord 
Charles Cornwallis. 

Researchers from INA and 
Texas A&M became involved 
because the institute is the 
world leader in training under-
water archaeologists and land-
locked Texas A&M is the only 
American university offering a 
master's degree in anthropolo-
gy with a speciality in nautical 
archaeology. 

Catholic 

Life insurance 

Union 
BMA Hospitalization 

Group & individual 

Cancer Fund 
Insurance 

Pat Knabe 
Representative 

Rt.1, Box 149 
Muenster, Tex. 

7594888 1-xo, 

SH Cafeteria 
School Menu 

Oct 6 - 10 
Monday - Pressed ham san-
dwiches, w/lettuce, 
vegetable soup, pears, milk. 
Tuesday - Corny dogs, pinto 
beans, carrot and pineapple 
salad, bread, milk. 
Wednesday - Lasagna 
w/cheese, lettuce salad, fruit 
cup, bread, milk. 
Thursday - Fried chicken, 
rice, cream gravey, Italian 
mixed vegetables, fruit, 
bread, milk. 
Friday - Meat Loaf, mashed 
potatoes, green beans, apple 
rings, bread, milk. 

College; Dr. Carl Hoagland, 
chairman of the Division of 
Teacher Education and 
Home Economics at IWC 
will be the principal speaker. 
Dr. Peter O'Connor, 
academic dean, will then in-
troduce each of the Centen-
nial Junior Scholars and 
present certificates. Dr. 
Mary Louise Mueller, 
chairman of the IWC 
scholarship committee will 
then announce names of the 
eight students who will be 
offered a full-tuition 
scholarship to IWC. 

A reception will follow in 
Marian Hall on campus. 

New Arrivals! 
Mr. and Mrs. Jeffery 

Balthrop of Muenster an-
nounce the arrival of a son, 
born in Muenster Memorial 
Hospital on Monday, Sep-
tember 29, 1980, at 3:19 
a.m. weighing 6 lb. 10 oz. 
He has been named Jeffery 
James Abraham. He joins a 
sister, Catrina, at home. The 
grandparents are Mrs. 
Jolyne Rautio and Mr. and 
Mrs. James Balthrop all of 
Muenster, and Clarence 
Rautio of St. Paul, Minn. 
The great-grandparents are 
Mrs. Gladys Balthrop of 
Rosston, Mr. and Mrs. R. 
Reid of near Dallas and Mr. 
and Mrs. Arnold 
Spiegelberg of Vancouver, 
Wash. and Mrs. Hilja Lund 
and Mrs. Lempi Harms, 
both of Menahga, Min-
nesota. Mrs. Jeffery 
Balthrop is the former Anne 
Rautio. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles 

Barber are parents of their 
first child, a daughter, 
Angela Christine, born in 
Wichita General Hospital on 
September 26, 1980 at 7 
p.m. The grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Hud-
speth of Forestburg and Mr. 
and Mrs. David Barber of 
Burkburnett. The great-
grandmother is Mrs. Irene 
Harry of Rosston. Mrs. 
Charles Barber is the former 
Paula Hudspeth. 

Report your News 
to the 

ENTERPRISE 
759-4311 
Box 190 

F.H.A. Installation 
On Monday, Sept. 22, 

1980, the Muenster F.H.A. 
Chapter held its annual in-
stallation of officers and 
reception of new members. 
Officers installed were 
president, Carol Klement; 
vice-president, Mary Winn; 
secretary, Kristi Oakley; 
treasurer, Nancy Walter-
scheid; reporter, Judy Dit-
tfurth; parliamentarian, 
Barbie Wimmer; sergeant-
at-arms, Brenda Wimmer; 
song leaders, Rene Stelzer 
and Traci Sawyer; pianist, 
Peggy Winn; and historian, 
Claudia Flusche. New mem-
bers being installed were 
Debbie Bindel, Terrye Ed-
munds, Cynthia Fleeman, 
Diane Gibson, Pam Her-
mes, Renate Hess, Paula 
Russell, Cindy Tisdale and 
Jill Wimmer. 

After the installation, a 
business meeting was held. 
Items discussed were: chili 
supper, powder-puff foot-
ball game, the making of a 
quilt, the State Fair and the 
state meeting. 

Afterwards punch and 
cookies were served. A 
special thanks was given to 
the Homemaking classes for 
making the cookies. 

State Fair 
On Sat., Oct. 4, 1980 the 

Muenster F.H.A. and 
F.F.A. members will attend 
the State Fair. It will be a 
special day for all F.H.A. 
and F.F.A. members across 
the state. 

IWC to Honor 
Junior Scholars 

FHA Horizons 	CCD Liturgy 
Honors Theresa 
of Child Jesus 

FHA officers elected to lead the chapter 
in 1980-81 are: front row Carol Klement 
president; Mary Winn vice president; 
Kristi Oakley secretary; Nancy Walter-
scheid treasurer. Back row: Joni Sturm 

Muenster 
State Bank 

759-2257 	Member FDIC 

advisor; Barbie Wimmer parliamentarian; 
Brenda Wimmer sergeant-at-arms; Traci 
Sawyer song leader; Claudia Flusche 
historian; Peggy Winn pianist; Judy Dit-
tfurth reporter; Rene Stelzer song leader. 

as 2D, 

Special Current Rate 
for 36 month 

NEW CAR LOANS 

12.83% 
Annual Percentage Rate 

Qualified borrowers can be ready to enjoy the 

new 1981 models which are making their appe-

arance on showroom floors right now! 

6 month Money Market Certificates currently 
earn 11.968 070 effective Sept. 2 - 8. 
2 1/2 year savings certificates also available. 

Substantial Interest penalty required for early withdrawal. 



Sauer 
Prices Effective thru Wed. Oct. 8, 1980 

Al GLADLY 

ACCEPT 
* F000 * 

STAMPS 

DEL MONTI—CREAM OR FAMILY STELE 	1 

Golden Corn 
3 17 OZ 

CAMS 

1 00 I 	 MOINE 

Black Pepper 

8 02. CAN 99 4  

STATE FAIR OF TEXAS 

DISCOUNT TICKETS 
(ADMITS ADULT OR CHILD) 

REG. ADMISSION 
PRICE 	53.00 
YOU SAVE $1.21 

$ 79 
WITH EACH $5.00 PURCHASE EXCL. CIGARETTES 

USDA CHOICE HEAVY BEEF 

T-Bone Steak 

LS
Z98 
298  

CALIF. CHM VALENCIA 

ORANGES 
4.$ 1" 

USDA CHOICE NEAVT BEEF 

Sirloin Steak 
S '48 

LB. MM. 

) NR 12 OZ BOTTLES $699 

CASE 

BEER 
Old Milwaukee 

Coke to or 	8/ $ 1 29  

Coke 32 02 	6/ $ 239  

SHURFINE 

Cane Sugar 
LB. $ 0178 

BAG 
LIMIT I PER FAMILY WITH MINIMUM 010.00 PURCHASE 	4  

SWIFT'S TEND'R LEAN 

Pork Roast] 
Boston $ 	08 
Butt 

LB. 

Oct. 10-12 — The seventh annual 

Polk County Folklife Festival, Liv• 
ingston. A full slate of events foi 

every age includes an antique show 

antique auto show. armadillo race. 

arts & crafts. dancing. bake-off. quilt 

auction, parade. bubble gum blowing 

contest, mini marathon, arm wrestl-

ing, rail splitting, 42 tournament, 

banana eating contest, rodeo. trail-

ride and hoedown. There's lots of 

food and more! For information 

contact the Chamber of Commerce. 

Box 839T, Livingston 77351 (713-
32749291. 

• • • 

Oct. 10, 12, 14 and 17 — Houston 
Grand Opera, Jones Hall for the 

Performing Arts, Houston. Opening 
its silver anniversary season. the 

Opera will present IL TROVATORE 

sung in Italian. For dciails contact the 
Opera, 615 Louisiana. Houston 

77002 (713-227-52771 

• • • 
19-19 — The eight annual Wes-

tern Week Celebration, B. County 

Coliseum, Beeville. This celebration 

pays tribute to the area's rich western 

heritage with a wide variety of events 

providing something for everyone. 

Highlights include a parade. chili 
cookoff, rodeo performances and 

nightly dances. Also an old fiddlers' 

contest. Indian dancers. gunfighters. 

cavalry riders, turtle derby. art show. 

and international foods. For infor-

mation contact Chip Latcham. WW 

publicity chairman. Box 10T, Bee-
ville 78102 (512-358-3267) 

. . 

Oct. 17-19 — Kermesaar, Civic Cem 
ter, El Paso. Sponsored by the Guild 

of the El Paso Museum of Art, this is 

a pried arts and crafts show billed as 

presenting the "best from the South-
west." One hundred and fifty exhi-

bitors from several states will partici-

pate. For more information contact 

Mrs. Robert Lane Jr.. 33100' Gabel. . 

El Paso 79904 (915-751-1756) 

• • . 

Oct. 23-26 — C•vOlLcade, Port 

Arthur. This salute to the oil industry 

of Southeast Texas has a busy sche-

dule of activities, many free. There 

are street and water parades. name 

stage entertainment, a giant flea 
market, tennis tournament. golf 

tournament, arts & crafts and much 

more. For a complete schedule con-
tact CasOlLcade Box 2336T. Port 
Arthur 77640 (713-963-1107) 

• • • 
Oct. 24-26 — Shrimporee, Aransas 

Pass. Moved this year from May to 

October, the Shnmporee will still 

spotlight the world's shrimp eating 
contest. blessing of the fleet, a parade. 

arts & crafts and lots of food. For 

details contact the Chamber of Com-

merce, 452T Cleveland Blvd.. Aran-

sas Pam 78336(512-758-27501. 

• • • 
Oct. 31-Nov. 9 — Wuntlest, New 

Braunlets. A giant among the State's 

celebrations. this salute to the area's 

sausage industry features "worst at its 

best." a wide variety of food (most 
with some sort of German connec-

tion), sports events. polka music and 

dancing. It is a family event. Myron 
Flores of the Lawrence Welk Show 

continues to highlight the Wursthalle 

show with his accordion music. Gates 

open Monday-Friday at 5:30 p.m.. 

Saturday and Sunday at noon. Ad-

mission 52 to the grounds. S3 to the 
Wursthalle For a brochure contact 

Wurstfest. Box 180T. New Braunfels 

78130 (512-62.5-2385). 

• • . 

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT 

TO: All persons interested in the 

Estate of Nick Block, Deceased, in-

cluding its creditors (if any): 

Take notice that on the 21st day 

of August, 1980, RITA SAN-

DMANN, MARY JANE FLE1T-

MAN and CAROLYN 

LUTKENHAUS, Post OM. Ad-

dress.: Box 103, Lindsay, Texas; 

2617 Loy Lake Road, Denison, 

Texas; and Route 2, Gainesville, 

Texas; respectively, were appointed 

Co-Executrices of the Estate of 

Nick Block, Cause No. 10,980, now 

pending on the docket of the Coun-

ty Court of Cooke County, Texas. 

All persons having claims against 

the above estate shall present the 

same within the time prescribed by 

law. 

SIGNED: 

Rita Sandm.n 

Mary Jane Fleitman 	blli 
Carolyn Lutkenhaus 

IIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII 

ILimit 2 Tubes 

5 OZ. TUBE 79 e 
Crest 

REG. OR MINT TOOTH PASTE 
MARYLAND CLOD 

Coffee Ill Cr n1. 

FREEn DRIES COFFEE 

Tasters Choice 
FREEZE DRIED COFFEE 

 Tasters Choice 
1NTI-FREEZE 0 COOLANT 
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Quantity Rights Worm!  

HARVEST—WHOLE 

Boneless Ham 

NIPS 	
CRISCO PURE VEGETABLE 

Tomato Juice 	4 B2.1.  69 0  Shortening 	3 cL,B. $2" 

• 

5-7 Lb. Avg. Wt. 

68 
LB. 

  

Seedless Grapes 

LB. 39 e 

AROUND THE WORLD'80 

State Fair of Texas 

CALIFORNIA THOMPSON 

SHURFINE 

Tomato Catsup 	1" 
BANS—SMOOTH OR CRUNCHY 

Peanut Butter 	11 
 oz 

 $119 JAR 

LE SUED" NMI 

Sweet Peas 	"N. 49C 
HORMEL VIENNA 

Sausage 	 Bccizi39' 

Whole Tomatoes 	"1  COON 39' 

Armour Star Chicken Fried Steaks 	Lc '1" 

AF. All Meat Corn Dogs 	 10 CT '1" 

Swift's Sizzlean Sliced Bacon 	12.g  $145 

0/1001112.4 Lb I.I. RL I 

Ham Halves I. 91 71 USDA CHOICE HEAVY BEEF 

MONK/ SLICERII,. Muir, RN 	 Chuck Roast 	  LA '1" 
Cooked Ham 	'41: '1" Shoulder Arm Roast 	 L.. '2" 
FROM FROTH LIRGE NEM 

Spare Ribs 	L. 18' 
TYSON VS01 GRADE . 0 SKR 

Fryer Breast 	o  '1" 
TYSON ON Or '1" MIR 

Drumsticks 	La 5 1 29  
 

TYSON 1111111 

Bologna 	VI 79' 
OM MIMI WIENERS 

Beef Franks 	:It '1" 
OSCAR MITER suers 

Ham & Cheese 	4 5 1" Chopped Ham 	 '1" 

* * * * * * OCTOBER 3-19 * * 

FI NEST QUALITY MEATS AT LOWEST PRICES 

 

< SWIFT'S TENOR LEN 105101 IMO 

Pork Steak   

  

WASHROOM 

• Bartlett Pears 	  

`Sparkling Fresh" Produce 
CILIFORIIII OHO 

Avocados 

Delicious Apples 	 
Calif. Peaches 	  
Bell Pepper 

USDA 000110 MOO BEEF-11111ELESS 

Shoulder Swiss Steak 	 L. '2" 
USDA CHOICE HEAVY BEEF 

Boneless Strip Steak 	24" 
USDA CHOICE HEAVY BEEF 

Chuck Steak 	  Le '1" 
USDA CHOICE HEAVY BEEF 

Shoulder Arm Roast 	 LA '1" 

LEAN INN TINDER CENCI 

Cube Steak 	L. '2" 
Fens FROSTED COMMA 

Beef Steaks 	5.4 '7" 
TYSON 0501 GRADE 	 '• "1 

Fryer Thighs 	L.. '1" 
TYSON CMICIEN 

Franks 	 '41 63' 
01C111 MINN 

Brauns Roll 	IDE 79' 
UCH MOEN SLICED 

3 FOR 1 1" 

L. 39' 

31K 98 0   
o. 49' 

 o. 49' 

<  

r 

SPAMLUNCHEON 
MEAT 

LIMIT 1 CAN 

L. 12 OZ. CAN 99 

This Week's SilverStone Feature Piece 

12" Covered Chicken Fryer 

with each and every 
$10 purchase all week. 

SILVER SPIN MAROS SLAB 

Sliced Bacon 	 

SIMINFIIESN•SalAmi. Luscboos.lelogsa 

Sliced Meats  	5 1'' 

FOX DELUXE ASSORTED 

PIZZA 

> 	IN HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS 	< 
100 COURT TABLETS — Rag. 12.11 	

111 79 Bufferin ... • 
Arthritis Formula ""'"'" 	'1" 
Ban Quick Dry Roll-On 	10oz '1 2 ' 
Ban Roll-On Deod..1Ig-Ex Largo oz 

929 

Body On Tap Shampoo "" 	'1" 
4-Way Nasal Spray ttizi ,50 
OBLONG PAN, LOAF PAN CURIE SHEET, PIZZA PIN 

Bakers Secret ellEVIARE ASSORTIEUT 
Ea 

5 189 

1  SYLVANIA INSIDE FROST NO, 15, 100 VI 1 . 

LIGHT BULBS  Bog "823„ 99'  
UM CRUM RFD Ile, 

Noxzema 
	

'1" 
COMTE Ate 41 1 

Toothpaste 
	

'1 02  
TOMER RD II AI 

Baby Powder 	"199' 
140 

Pizza Pans 
	 1 108 

SIAM 

Grape Jelly 	 11Z  65' 
AIM STYLE 

 Plain Chili 	 "1  5 1" 
MITRE Pill GRAPEFRUIT 

Juice 	 41:4  79' 
111101FIRSIIVANILLA RAMS II MI 

Cookies 	3 84:1 '1" 
unseD 

Nina Wafers 	11,g 83 0  
MIME 

Pampers 	  so, '2" 
MOW KM OM le 116'1

Alum. Foil  	95' 
DETERGENT 

Era Liquid 	 `401 
 $329 

DISARMING OETE01f1 

Cascade 	 wOI. '2" 
FABRIC SOFTENER 

Downy 	 s '2°' 
COM 

Cleanser 	 ".1;  39' 
TOILET 1001 GLUM 

Lysol 	 NUL 99 0  

II a 9239 

DEL MOM 

Catsup 
SALAMI!. AMES DR SLICES 

Peaches 

MORT STRAWBERRY 

	

Preserves 	 'NI' 95' 
OMAN NINES—NSA 

	

 Mix 	 '"tai.• 89' 
7 MITE OLD MARRED OR 

	

Quick Oats 	 101 750 
FRISILIE ASS, 

	

Cat Food 	 3 `I.% '1" 

OVER1116111 

Pampers 
WIROR LAWN MI 

Bags """' 	 ,„ 99 0  
DETERGENT 

Oxydol 	 "X. 5 1" 
DMA RUT., 

Joy Liquid 	 Tt 9" 
ORI 

Bath Soap 	 85' 
LYSOL LIQUID 

Cleaner 
BATIIMIP TILE 

Lysol Spray 
REMAR 

Lysol 	 "C°I. '1" 

Df 99' 

490 

II. co '2" 

MORTON—ASSORTED 

POT PIES 
3%1  $ 1 oo Ie 101 

NORTON ASSORTED 

Dinners 	1141: 79 0  
> 	DAIRY SPECIALS 	< 
"!". 

Lite Line 	 IOU  '1" 
BONN HIM W11111E0 SLICED 

Amer. Cheese 	11.1 151 

NOMA RISC x111 VOON 

Horn Cheese 	VI: 0 2" 

MN.. MEACHAM 

SHURFINE VEGETABLE 

OIL "oz.-  $ 179 11-11.5 OZ. 7 
PACKAGE 

IISIIFUCTIIE MIRK :pi 	  

Lysol 	 

Jelin 
wuu 

Toilet Tissue 

BETTY CROCKER 8 OZ 

31 9100 

41•1" 

Hamburger Helper 	79c 	 

1 OZ. $259 

I OZ. 9429 

Prestone 	 G. '4" 
Cliff 	 II WPM 

Plates 	 89' > FROZEN FOODS DEPT. < 

I SHURFINE 170Z. 

Corn 	5,$100) 
GEO. J. 

Carroll 

01171 

In All 
The World 

No one is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you. 
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759-4311 or 759-4351 	noon Wednesday to p ace class' le 

N .  Y  MAIDS—a.. FOIEST HILLS 48MS 107. 

A 

Sears Place your 

Wish Book' order 
of 875 before 

October 20. and get 
a 10C discount 5.44a  

Do your Christmas shopping from 
your favorite easy chair — and get a 
10% discount on orders of $75 or more' 
You'll find so many great gift ideas in 
our Wish Book toys, clothing, tools. 
home appliance So. order today! 

759-2550 
to place your order 

I Sears I 315 E. California 

Gainesville 
FREE PARKING 

Helm Arnenrasraeis 

CARD OF THAI110) 
I want to thank my uncle Bishop 
Danglmam, Coaches. Father 
Stephen, and John LeBrasseur. 
Virgil Henscheid, Ronnie Hess and 
Mike Stoffels; also Leon Reitman 
and Carol Grewing; my teammates, 
classmates and the student body of 
SHHS: my relatives, neighbors and 

esp -ecially Dr. Knight and Dr. 
Juarez and the nurses of Muenster 
Memorial Hospital and J. D. 
Caplinger for are and concern. for 
cards, visits and flowers, candy, 
hooks and phone calls and many 
other favors while I was 
hospitalized. I am very grateful. 
Mike Dangelmayr and to Mom and 
Dad, Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Dangelmayr: and my brothers, 
Ron, Chris and Darrell. 

46-IC I P 

1111fCELLAIlE011i 
For Home Delivers of 

EMI Worth Star Telegram 
or Dallas Morning News 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828.13x. 546, Sanger. 16-tf 

IF ANYONE SAW THE PERSON 
who ran into the back of our trailer 
(which in turn rammed our pickup 
tail gate virtually destroying it) 
please let us know. Hess Furniture 
7594455 46-2C1 

BEAT INFLATION THE EASY 
way. Have your prescription Idled 
at the Discount Pharmacy in Muen-
ster, MSIC1 

REDUCE SAFE AND FAST with 
GoBese tablets and E-N'ap "water 
pills". Muenster Pharmacy 

ee..3CIP 

FEEL BETTER FAST; We have B- 
15 at Muenster Pharmacy. .0C1P 

OPEN YOUR OWN RETAIL ap-
parel shop. Offer the latest in jeans, 
denims and sportswear. 514,850 in-
cludes inventory, fixtures, et.. 
Complete Store! Open in as little as 
2 weeks anywhere in U.S.A. (Also 
infants and children shop). Call 
Suc, Toll free 1-800-874-4780. 

16-1MIP 

FOR IALE) 
SURPLUS 	JEEP 	value 
53196...sold for 544. Call 312-742-
1142 ext. 251 for info on how to 

purchase bargains like this. 
.10.011' 

NEW STOCK — BEDROOM 
Suites, Dinette Suites, Living Room 
Suites. Fight high prices. Shop at 
JoMac Used Furniture in 
Gainesville. Hwy 82 at stop light. 

665-1912 

OE•LER 

Oai ,MeeIM 96066.64 owww 

BATTERIES 
Large Selection 

The freshest maple in town 
for cal.:slaters waren*. 

cameras, flublights, 
and rwhergeables. l Radio That* 

Metal Buildings 
CURSE I 1 ES 

All steel oznettes available at fac-
tory direct prim. Immediate 
delivery. Examples of over-stocked 
prices: 40.60 55996.00; 50x80 
58989.00; 50x90 59874.00; 50.150 
513,783.00. Big doors included 
Limited supply of start-
twalls/straichtwalls also available 

Dealership inquiries welcome. Call 

Gordon toll-free (8001525-9926. 

FOR SALE: COKER WHEAT 
SEED, in bulk. Billy Bayer, 759- 
2514. 	 sxci 

FOARCE SAL4E: 1 FLOOR FUR- 

Ndehumielifier. sTP'ory Hboenmieg7 , 759-1 
 4142. 	 sXI F 

FOR SALE: 1974 FORD F-350, ex-
cellent condition, new tires, new 
bed, 4-speed, 390 C.I.D. 53.500.00, 
Gainesville Ford Tractor. 817-665-
6741. aelc, 

Stock Tanks 
Round 

3 fl 108 ft dia . 

Oblong 
2x4 ft. to 3x8 ft. dia. 

Priced to Sell 
Immediate Delivery 

Wil-O-Mac 
Gainesville 

STEVENS' 
FLOOR COVERING 

Gainesville's Volume Dealer 

• Jos w. gmemew Over SO Raja arenas of Floor Comings 
etelmerlile 

Building Materials 

F ling - Paneling 

Muenster 
Building Center, Inc. 

759 , 2232 

SPECIAL 

16' x 52" Stock Panels 
517.90 

6 ft. T Posts 

S2.28 each 

Muenster Building 

Center. Inc. 

1979 DODGE PIC ALP lot sale 
Gary .1 Walterschad, 759-2725 

as /C 

PRE FINISHED 
PANELING 

in stock at 
Community Lumber Co. 

STORM WINDOWS 
Made in Our Factory 

All types of 
glass repair. 

FREE Estimates 

Energy Efficient 
Home Products 

-e. 817-665-9738 
315481 

GLASS: Rate, window, auto-
mobile, furniture tops, mirrors 
Complete glass service. We handle 
insurance claims. Gainesville Glass 
Shop, 665-3321, 311 N. Chestnut. 

37-tf 

SURPLUS JEEPS, CARS AND 
TRUCKS available through gover-
nment agencies, many sell for under 
5200. Call 602-941-8014, mt. 674 
on how to obtain your surplus 
directory. el-eCIP 

FOR SALE: MELEX electric golf 
cart with battery charger. Tilt 
trailer Like new. Leonard Endres. 

es-XiP 

Call Jan Cain 

For Mary Kay 

Cosmetics 
and Re-orders 

Free Delivery 

and Facials 

759-4408 ,, ,,„, 

Call 

Dan Luke 
759-2522 

FOR 

FINA GAS 

FINA OIL ' 

we sell and install 
propane tanks and 

equipment 

SCHILLING 
Propane Service 

759-2505 P.O. Box 532 
Muenster, Texas 76252 

INSULATE for comfort and 
economy. Community Lumber Co 
Muenster. 52 

Burleson Bells 

AUSTIN. Texas ■ Spi — A 

note of nostalgia will be struck 
in 1981 at The University of 
Texas 

Eleven bronze bells. which 
chimed atop the tower of the 
Old Main Building from 1930 
to 1934. will be refurbished 
and reinstalled in a new set-

ting on the east side of the 
campus. Supporting the bells. 
which weigh from 29 to 560 
pounds. will be sin pylons. 

Cast in France. the bells 
were given to the Universit ■ 
in 1929 by Albert Sidni, 
Burleson. an  1884 UT law 
graduate who later became 
1 . .5. Postmaster General 

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies 

Structural Steel 

and Pipe 

Complete Line 
of Bolts and 

Miscellaneous 
Hardware 

Metal Sales, Inc. 
On High.. 82 

west of Gainesville 29 .1 

FOR SALE: Cemetery Monu-
ments, all sizes. Reasonably priced 
See J. P. Flusche or phone 759-2205 
or - .7 , 220 ,  

FOR REPTI 

HUNTERS! 
Excellent deer. quail and 
rurkey leases. Call Randy. 
214- 72 7-3400 	MLXB1 

MOBILE HOME for rem, 2 bed-
room, fully furnished, a block from 
school on N. Walnut. Ph. 759- 
2938. Jerome Pagel. You'i IN STOCK 

Electrical — Plumbing 
Paneling — Roofing 

Hardware — Water Pumps 
Heating — Air-conditioning 
We can recommend an installer 

Muenster Building Center, Inc. 

NOW LEASING 

U-Store and Lock 

Mini Storage 

759-4212 
514E 1st St. Muenster 

Roofing 
Double Coverage T-Lock, 245 pound 

Seal Tab Square Butt, not double coverage 
We have both in stock 

Muenster Building Center, Inc. 
759 2232 

FOR SALE: 	8000 BTU 
refrigerated au conditioner. 759-
:502. Mrs. Bob Ssvirczynski. 

44.ICI 

USED 
TELEPHONE 

POLES 
For Sale at 

COMMUNITY' 
LUMBER COMPAN Y 

New Fall 

Arrivals 

Resistol 

Felt Hats 
Hand Creased 

Tempeo & Comfy 
Goose down 

Coats 

H-Bar-C & Kerman 

Western Shirts 
Long Sleeve 

Tony Lama 

Boots 

Name Belts 
and Billfolds 

Jack Cheaney 

Saddle Shop 
211 West Elm 
Gainesville 

,0-1111 

/ 	  

ALL CAROLYN WALTER 
SCHEID FOR MARY KAY COS 
METICS, 759-4128. 

Sewing Machines 
Vacuum Cleaners 

Stereos, Tapes 
Recants & Accessories 

Sales & Service 
ALL MAKES 

Hudgins 
209 W Calif Gaines,' 
Phone 665-2542 

HAY FOR SALE 
ALL TYPES 

B 8 R Hay Service 
Richard Doyle 
214367-7596 caul 

Modem Floors and Fabnm has 
renewal stickers for car license 
plates. 46-tf 

FOR SALE: TWO young Hereford 
bulls, subject to registration. Rich 
Grewing 7590166 or Dave Bayer 
759-2791 

mac, 

Es1:1:11 
TRACTORS 

For sale or lease 
Agriculture and 

Industry 

CASE POWER 
AND EQUIPMENT 

Albert Zimmerer 

665-4314 	1 X. ,  

WRANGLERS 
Shoes • Boots 

Work Dress Western 

Nocona Boots 

J.R. Hocker 
Men's 8 Boys' Store 

207 N. Commerce, Gainesville 
MO 

Clocks 

Repaired 
and most watches includin 

Seiko. Bulova, Quartz 
and Timex 

Antiques 
Completely restored 

Diamond 
Setting 

Ring sizing while wu wall 

by appointment only 

36 years experience 

Seeds Jewelry 
307 N. Grand Village 

Ph 817465-4812 
Gaines ,  ilk. Texas, 76240 

DALE's 
CARPET 

SHOP 

FINE DIAMONDS 

WATCHES, JEWELRY 
WATCH REPAIR 

KOESLER JEWELRY 
Muenster 

PHO. 665.2208 

S  
PROTECT YOU and your house 

while you sleep. Smoke alarms 
available at Community Lumber 
Company. 37-if 

     

Boat For Sale 

if,' Del Magic 
Chrysler 105 HP. 

Dilly 16' Trailer 
James W. Fleitman 

759-2855 

 

      

 

Sears 

    

   

 

CERAMIC TILE. New and old 
installation. For estimate call Ted 
Henscheid, 759-4280. Muenster. 5If 

FOR SALE: ABE SEED WHEAT 
and Nora Seed Oats. BULK.Garry 
Fetsch 759-4890. 	 42.9C1 

        

Continuous 
aluminum 
°ut tering tni 

We'll go to any length' 

Let Sears Authorized lm 

mailers cumarnfit and in , 
 mall new aluminum glit-

tering at your home with 
a (Wary-on-wheels. 

For a FREE Estimate call 

Jean Tutt 
Gainesville, Texas 

759-2550 	, 

ask about Sear. credit plan, 

SE MRS. ROEBUCK AND CO. 

 

Interstate 
Batteries 
You do not need 

to be a Farm 

Bureau member to 

buy therm batteries. 

12 V passenger 
car, group 24 

$3925 
up 

Knabe Tire 
& Radiator 
Muenster, 759 -4141 

   

   

Modern Floors & Fabrics 
The one place shopping center 

for home decorating needs.  

Carpet Vinyl Tile 
Carpet Cleaning • Custom 

Window Treatment • Wallpaper 
Ceiling Fans Light Fixtures 

Formica • Clocks 
Fabrics - Patterns - Notions 

206 N. Main. Muenster. 759-2848 

AUCTION SALE 
11 A.M. - WED. OCT 8, 1980 

THE ESTATE OF 

ROBERT BURNSIDE 

3 3 J 
5 

Miles N. 

Mi les West 

E. of Ponder 

of Denton 

LUNCH WILL BE AVAILABLE 

Tractors 	Motor Vehicles 	Equipment 
2670-4 WHEEL DRIVE CASE TRACTOR-1600 Nii 	 J.D. 1214 -12 FT. GOOSENECK NINDROWER 

Send= 6769146 	 3 ..1.O =8300 GRAIN DRILLS - 24 HOLES im 6 7  
979-CASE TRACTOR 2800 Has.. CAB & AIR Sm.' e 8,21013,4 	. ROLLER PACKERS 
240-YAIMER TRACTOR . 60 7  BELLY ArnaEn 3 DRILL J.D GRAIN HITCH 

1 D HEADER TRAILER 1974-FORD 750 TRUCK TRACTOR . FIFTH WHEEL, 
WINCH & MN POLES DONAHUE 25 FT. HEADER TRAILER 

1977-CNC 3 4 TM 4 WHEEL DRIVE PICKUP 	 DONAHUE ROUND BALE MOVER . CYLINDERS 
1965- MAO( TANDEM TRUCK TRACTOR 	 J.D. -RA 12 RUN CULTIVATOR . TRANSPORT 
1958-CHEV. 40 SERIES TRUCK 	 ATTACHMENT 
1975-FORD 2-.- TON TRUCK . GRAIN DUMP BED 	 1.D.20 FT. ROTARY HOE . TRANSPORT ATTACHMENT 
1776-JEEP CHEROKEE 

FT HEADER 
NIL RICH 36 FT. FIELD CULTIVATOR . mULCHERS 

J.D TURBO 7700 COMBINE . 20 
756 HRS. CAB & AIR 

12 Pig PLANTERS 
J. 	12 FT HEADER . 110" PICKUP ATTACHMENT 

24 FT MILLER TANDEM DISC Send= I5FL42215 JD. =1210- 500 BU. GRAIN CART 
1.0,=510 ROUND HAY BAILER ID.. 10 BLADE GNEWAY 
1 D. =290-2D FT. GRAIN SWATHER HESSTON =530A STAC101AND 

HESSTON .30 STACK MOVER 
CASE M75 FRONT END LOADER 

DIRECTIONS TO SALE SITE 36 FT. TANDEM GRAIN TRAILER . BELLY DEAF 

33 FT. TANDEM VAN 
33 FT. TANDEM GRAIN TRAILER 

1 
42 FT. 8" GRAIN AUGERP.T.O.DRIVER 

380 35 FT.6" GRAIN MISER . GAS siTR. 
300 GAL FUEL TANK OR TRAILER 
300 GAL FUEL TANK . STAND f 
100 GAL FUEL TANK . VACU PUMP 
C( TINENTAL PTA PUMP 

2. m now.< TAIL GATE AUGER . GAS AIR.  POWDER RIVER CATTLE CHUTE 
. PORTABLE LOADING CHUTE 

_ 25 METAL PANELS 
6 METAL GATES 

./ 

II 
	.. 1 	_iii- 	- 

it.  
— 

Cattle sprseer . 250 gal. folk, gas mfr.& PDpawn 
eliminator mist awn, model :21, Gostaisan seed 

neater, Sears air compressat w 3 H.P. Ins me., 
M110 225 we elec. welder, acetylene gapes, 

hose & tips. 

- Large assortment ol eons truck fires& wheels, 

shop eauipwent, •ice, grinders, else rrars , 
Sol, pus pipe md .r.cm other tens 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION, CONTACT 

Ward Brothers Auctioneers, Inc. 	ANNOUNCEMENTS  
11100 ALK010.01 

Gut 1iONI IRS OF  Rt. iSt•tt 	 InefSIOCK RCACMIlYiltr end FOUIPM001 1,2115 011.1000. 

OV.11.0. warren • a sox toss 1M/0 INMOST  110. 
101 1101 	 1100.111 

101 INMAN MAII0 	 in 14,061 	 CECIL MARI, 	 AND orate Acm. 



WANTED ) 

Permanent and 
Full Time Help 

Wanted 
Russell Newman Mfg. Co. 

Saint Jo, Texas 

Apply Monday through Friday 
8:30 a.m. to 2:30 p.m. 

33,13i 

NOTICE 
Immediate openings for reliable and experienced rod 

machine operators and helpers. Helpers need not be experien-
ced. If willing to work we will be glad to train. 

Good pay and equipment. Uniforms and group insurance 
available. Plenty of work and hours per week. Equal oppor-
tunity employer. 

Grewing Brothers Inc. 
Walter, 759-4811(pusher pickup - day) 759- 

4256 (res.) 	Richard, 759-4166 

HELP WANTED 
Part time 

Apply at Hamrlcs 
44.1( 

HELP WANTED: Parts and shop 
helper; apply in person at Wilde 
Chevrolet Co. Muenster. 	Mel 

HELP WANTED: General office 
work. Wilde Chevrolet Co. Apply 
in person. 15.XC 

HELP WANTED 
We need experienced help for immediate em-

ployment in the best equipped factory in the 

North Texas area .  

Paid Holidays, Paid Vacations 

Hospitalization, Profit Sharing 

JR. ELITE 
Dress Manufacturing Co. 

120 N Sycamore, Muenster 

DON'T BE 
STUCK-UP 

on Wallpaper. 

I will hang wallpaper in new 
horn. or  remodeled. Call Rita 
Russell. 759-4155 alter 7 p.m 

27-ti 

Dozer Service 
Call or See 

Frank Hess 
759-4249 22xcl 

Bob's 
Auto Service 

A/C Service 

Auto Transmission Serv. 

Engine Overhaul 

Car & Truck Elec. Sera 

Radiator Repair 

R. D. Walterscheid 
I 	759-4474 

37-tf 

DALE BAYER, INDEPENDENT 
BUILDER, carpenter work all 
types, 759-4868 after 5 weekdays. 

34-XCI 

"My Edward D. Jones 

& Co. broker is open 

on Saturdays ... just 

to serve people like 

me who don't have 

time during the week!" 

-Saturday s the only day I have to

business,handle my personal business, and 
thanks to Edward D. Jones & 
Co., it's easy My broker is free 
to discuss all of my investment 
needs that day and give me the 
perponal attention I think I 
deserve 

• Plan my investment 
goals and objec- 
tives. 

NEED MORE ROOM? 
We have just what you need; 5 
bedroom, 21/2 baths, nearly new. 
Central heat and air, carport. Call 
Jake Lawson, 668-8841 or First 
Realty - Gainesville 665-0376. 

46-21, I 

Homes for Sale 
Inquire at 

Muenster 
Building Center, Inc. 

759-2232 	
. 348 

FOR SA I.E IN MUENSTER 
11% OWNER 

3 bedroom house, horse barn, 
dr, barn. and 3' . acres. 

f 

/54-17.59 1312 1.Xel 

Ever wonder why things look so dark these 
days? Could it be that we're not asking for 
the light of Christ? 

All that is necessary for evil to 
triumph is that good men do nothing." 

— Edward Burke 

NOW LEASING 
2 Bedroom Apartments 

3 Bedroom Houses 
... Energy Efficient 

... Rent based on income to eligible tenants 

... Range and refrigerator furnished 

... Water paid 

... Centrally heated and air-conditioned 
For information contest 

The Housing Authority 
of Gainesville 	QPlaza 82 Office Center 
Gainesville, Tx. 817-885-1747 	

E euaH, opportunity

Hours 8 e.m. to 5:30 p.m. 
44.401 

REAL ESTATE 
NEW HOMES 2, 3, and 4 bed- 
rooms. Priced 935.000 to 575,000. 

95 percent financing available. Shag 
:arget, fireplace, ash cabinets. 

 

97 ACRES EXCELLENT pasture Frazier & Rodgers Construction 

land. Road on 2 sides, stock pond. Co., 665-5343, 1209 N. Grand, 
Will divide. 5500.00 per acre. Gainesville. 

LATEX HOUSE 
Colony PAINT VALUES 

OUR FINEST 
A house paint of truly out- 
standing durability. The 
beauty lasts for years 
longer than ordinary fin- 
ishes. Our largest color 
selection — all at one 
price. 

HUNDREDS OF COLORS 
A fine latex house 
paint, and even at this 
price, there is no ex- 
tra charge for your 
choice of hundreds 
of colors. 

WHY LATEX HOUSE PAINT 
Our experience has shown that a quality latex 
house paint is not only easier to apply than oh base, 
but it has far better color retention, stays more flex- 
ible and generally lasts longer than the finest oil 
finishes .  

Muenster Building Center, Inc 
759-2232 

Attention Farmers & Ranchers 

Free Removal of Fresh Dead 

or Disabled Horses and Cows 

Call Collect 817-665-0763 
Call as soon as possible for prompt service 

24 hour service 	7 days a week 

Gainesville Stock Removal Co. 
2 miles east of Gainesville on Highway 82 

New modern facilities...Clean sanitary trucks 'so ,  

Muenster Milling Company, Inc. 

322 N. Main 

'The Feed People-Serving The North Texas Area Since 1947' 
• Liquid Feed • Dry Feed • Veterinary Supplies • Wire-Twine 

"Specializing In High Quality Dairy Feed" 
"We Say Geoln" 

• Drying & Storage Facilities Available 

817-759-2287 Muenster Texas 

Big 
M 

Quality 
Foods 

CIRCLE SEVEN 
BRANGUS 

RANGE BULL SALE 
Saturday, October 18, 1980, 12:00 noon At The Ranch 

5 miles west of Jacksboro, Texas, on U.S. 281 

SELLING 135 BULLS 
100 Registered Brangus Bulls 
35 Commercial Brangus Bulls 

All bulls, Bangs T.B.and Fertility tested 

ALSO SELLING 300 COMMERCIAL 
BRANGUS FEMALES 

Ranging from open heifers to 
bred 3-year-olds 

400 to 650 pounds 

T%,mumoingilialwark 10111033k 
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Automotive M•ohlou• 
Shop Sorvic• 

grind calves - bore blocks 
grind crankshafts - custom 

engine budding 
SchrnIdlkoter 

Autemotly• Inc. 
835 N. Grand Ave. 

Gainesville 668.7241 

Don Flusche, Real Blare Broker 	2 tracts of land located about 6 
759-2832 	 37-xCi miles northeast of Muenster. 186 

acres at 5675 and 100 acres at 5600. 
DOWN TOWN MYRA, TEXAS Town & County Real Estate, 1209 

2 bedrooms, 1 bath, kitchen, living 
room, dining room, vinyl siding, j.,,,N -, G

, Lan,.1, Gainesville, 665-0419 or 

frame construction, attached office 	 2441 ------ 
or store building, 2 car detached 
garage. Corner lot, trees, good 
water. In the low 530s. Not real 
fancy but a real nice home. By ap- 
pointment only. 
Don Flusche Real Estate 
Broker 759-2832 Muenster 

HOME FOR SALE IN MUEN- 
STEROn paved and curbed street, 
brick, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 
fireplace, double garage, 2 patios,
central heat and air, back yard 
cedar fenced. Small down payment. 
financing available at below current 
rates. Henry Weinzapfel Real 
Estate, 759-2257 or 759-4161. 

39,C I 

Gainesville Ford 
Tractor Adds OMC 

Hay Machinery 

	

OMC 	(Owatonna 
Manufacturing Co., Inc.) is 
happy to announce the ad- 
dition of Gainesville Ford 
Tractor Co. to our 
Agricultural Dealer Force. 

Gainesville Ford Tractor 
Co. will be the authorized 
OMC Agricultural Dealer in 
Gainesville, Texas area. 
OMC has marketed fine 
quality haying equipment 
since 1865- a line of equip- 
ment that has continued to 
expand until now in 1980 
they handle: a complete line 
of windrowers, mixer-mills, 
stackers, and roll balers. 

OMC welcomes 
Gainesville Ford Tractor 
and invites you to visit them. 

HELP WANTED 
AT H&W Meat Co. 

Full time, 
Preferably Male 

42 %el 

Full or Part-time 
Waitress Wanted 

at the Center 

Restaurant & Tavern 
759-2910 	39 401 

I will babysit at your home day or 
night, except Thursdays. Rosa 
Juarez Ergos, 759-4401, 1052 North 

Cedar. WWI 

Inquire of our services when in 
need of, automobile, farm 
machinery, commercial or personal 
loans. Or, checking accounts, 
Saving Accounts, Safe Deposit 
Boxes, Travelers Checks, Collec-
tion and Exchange, Drive-in Service 
and 24 hour depository. 

MUENSTER STATE BANK 
A full Service Bank, 
Member F.D.I.C. 

PLUMBING 
Installation & Repair 

Residential & Commerical 
FIXTURES, SUPPLIES 
McDonald Water Pumps 

Robert Russell Plumbing 
759-4155 
Muenster 

G & H Backhoe 

& Dump Truck Service 

Herman Crewing, 
Bernard Hesse 

Sower Systems 

Oil Field & industrial Work 

Ph. 759-4130 or 759-4304 
Mobil Ph. 759-4812 

Sewing Machine Repairs 
All makes & models. In our store or 
in your home. 
Gehrig Sewing Center, 759-4112. 

12-tf 

WILL BABY SIT IN MY HOME 
DURING THE DAY FOR 
WORKING MOTHERS. Ages 2 
and up. 759-4426. 45-2C11,  

I WOULD LIKE TO BABYSIT at 
my home, 513 Elm, Muenster. Eva 
Nissen. 	 45-2C I 

R and A CONTRACTING: 
SHEET ROCK, ROOFING, 
PANELING AND INSULATION. 
ODD JOBS AND LIGHT 
HAULING. Richard and Anna 
Herr, 759-4478. 45-x0 

By Nell Tibbets 
Getting your soil tested 

has always been important, 
but now this proven practice 
is more important than ever, 
emphasizes Neil Tibbets, 
county agent with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser- 
vice, Texas A&M University 
System. 

Fertilizer is getting more 
and more expensive, so it's 
crucial for producers to get 
the most from their fertilizer 
dollar. And getting a 
profitable return from fer- 
tilizer depends on the level 
of available nutrients in the 
soil before fertilization. 
That calls for a soil test. 

A soil test will determine 
which nutrients are deficient 
in the soil for a particular 
crop so that a producer can 
fertilize to supplement those 
nutrients. It's not profitable 
to supply nutrients already 
available in the soil in suf- 
ficient quantities for a par- 
ticular crop or to supply ad- 

Lighting is Vital 

To Egg Production 
Fewer hours of daylight in 

fall and winter can mean 
real trouble for the egg 
producer who does not light 
his layers. 

"Most birds stop egg 
production and begin 
preparing for winter during 
this decreasing light 
period," says Dr. William 
0. Cawley, poultry 
specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser- 
vice, Texas &M University 
System. "Actually, it is this 
decreasing day length which 
kicks off the southern 
migration of wild birds and 
not the cool winds of 
autumn." 

Light entering the birds' 
eyes stimulates the pituitary 
gland to produce two hor- 
mones -- one causes the 
ovary to develop and the 
other results in release of the 
yolk, explains the specialist. 

Hens must receive a 
minimum of 12 hours of 
light per day to maintain an 
adequate blood level of 
these two hormones which 
are production-sensitive to 
decreasing day length. 
Therefore, laying hens 
should never receive less 
light than they do on June 
21, the longest day of the 
year, says Cawley. 

"Any drop in daylength is 
critical to hens that have 
been in production eight 
continued on page 12. 

ded nutrients that the crop 
does not need or cannot use. 

Now is an excellent time 
to take soil samples and 
have soil tested for fall crops 
as well as those for the 1981 
eason. Soil test results can 

be obrained more quickly 
his time of year due to a 

smaller volume than in the 

spring. And, once producers 
have their test results they 
can order the fertilizer they 
need for the coming season. 

So to get the most from 
your fertilizer dollar, get 
your soil tested now and 
them stock up on needed 
fertilizer to beat the late win- 
ter and early spring rush. 

HELP WANTED: 	FARM 
BUREAU seeking outstanding per-
son to service established insurance 
accounts in the Muenster area. Of-
fice and secretarial service 
provided. Company training 
program, 520,000 plus average first 
year income. Contact Rick Royal, 
Agency Manager, Cooke County 
Farm Bureau, 817-665-1763. 

3,XCI 

HELP WANTED — APPLY at 
City Hall. 	 364C1 

ATTENTION PARENTS! 
If you need an after-school babysit-
ter or tutor, please contact Sharon 
Michaels, 759-2787 	 43.XCI 

• Find out the latest 

conservative stock 

and bond invest- 

ments suited to my 

needs. 

• Learn more about 

the variety of con- 

servative invest- 

ment plans avail- 

able. 

Doing business on Saturday 
It's lust one more important 
reason why I like Edward I) 
Jones 8.‘ Co " 

Political 
Announcements 

For Sheriff 
of Cooke County 

KENNETH MAC FITTS 
Republican 

Pol. 	 pd. 	 Kenneth Mac Fills 

P 0 Box 1245, Geoesollc, Tx 7040 

Kenneth C. Floyd 
1st State Bank Bldg. 

Suite 305, Gainesville 
B17-665-0351 

WWI Edward 
v  D. Jonas 

& Co. 

I  SERVICE j 

CIRCLE SEVEN 
Land and Cattle Company 

Located in Clay & Jack Counties. Texas 

Phone 817/567.2045 
•/. 

111  4010101.41031011111 . 	iiii0111101110 011110 

— You'll like a Circle Seven bull— 
We guarantee it. —  

Apartments for Rent 
	

Importance of Soil Testing Increases 
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Don't 
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Till It's too Late 
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OUT OF 
HAND? 
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SAVE MONEY with 

FARMERS 
AUTO INSURANCE 
Be assured of modern, 

broad form coverage and 

fast, fair, friendly service 

FARMERS 
INSURANCE GROUP 

For information call 

Don Lester 
1023 E. Calif. 
Ph. 885-4357 
Gainesville 

Our policy is 
saving you money. 

Be informed • • • 
on Muenster area news 
and shopping values. 

Subscribe to the 

MUENSTER 

ENTERPRISE 
In Cooke County, 1 year 	  '6.00 

In Cooke County, 2 years 	  '11.00 

Outside Cooke County, 1 year 	 '7.00 

Outside Cooke County, 2 'Tars 	 '13.00 

Please circle one of the above .  

Name 	  
Address 	  

City & State 	  Zip 

Mail with check or money order to : 
Muenster Enterprise, Inc. 

P.O. Box 190, Muenster, Tx. 76252 
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Tigers Take FW Cardinals 27.14 

 

  

MHS Volley Team In Howe Tourney 

Jill Walterscheid returns the ball over the reach of opponents in Tuesday's match with 
Callisburg. Also shown are Brenda Wimmer and Judy Dittfurth. Janie Hartman Photo 

These MHS junior varsity girls playing Callisburg are Stephanie Richey, Peggy Winn, 
Ginnie Fisher and Mary Winn. 	 Janie Hartman Photo 

Hornets Bow to Valley View Eag 

Watch for it! 
It's Coming 
NOVEMBER 

8th 

to put your new Piano or Organ on 
Lay-away for that special person 

this Christmas. Ask about our easy 
90 day Lay-away plan. Arrange now 
for a surprise Christmas Eve delivery 

Remeber you can Layaway other musical 
Items such as guitars, amps, drums, band 
Instruments and others. Christmas sheet 

music and books now available 

Whatever you need 

Musically for Christ- 

kiln/ 

mas this year. 

we have it at 
430. 

Muiique Snopre 
,05 N Dl. on, Gainesville, 6650391 	45-201 

Muenster 	High's 
volleyball team is on the 
verge of a big Saturday, 
competing in a tournament 
at Howe. Other entries will 
be from Bonham, 
Callisburg, Howe, Frisco, 
Sanger, Whitesboro, Royse 
City, Allen and Bells. 

Their first match is the 
preliminary with Bells, 
which will decide whether 
they go into the champ or 
consolation bracket. Final 
play begins at 6:30 (third 
place); then 7:30 (con-
solation) and 8:30, (cham-
pionsip). 

The Hornettes were win-
ners in two matches with 
Callisburg Tuesday. Junior 
varsity started the good 
work by scores of 15-8 and 
15-4 with Mary Winn and 
Renee Wimmer the high 
scorers. 

The varsity also took two 
in a row, 15-7 and 16-14, the 
latter a great team effort and 
a definite improvement over 
last week's performance. 

SH Junior Teams 
Change Schedules 

Cancellation of junior 
varsity schedules by a num-
ber of area schools because 
of a shortage of players for 
both varsity and junior var-
sity teams, has left Sacred 
Heart with open dates on its 
junior schedule. Accor-
dingly Jon LeBrasseur, 
athletic director, has revised 
the SH schedule. 

He suggests that the 
previous schedule be 
replaced by this one. 

Thurs., Oct. 2, here, 
Alvord vs junior high, 6 
p.m.; S&S vs junior varsity, 
7:30. 
Sat., Oct. 11, at FW Coun-
try Day, junior high at 1 
p.m. preceding varsity 
game. 
Thurs., Oct. 16, at S&S, 
junior varsity, 7 p.m. 
Mon., Oct. 20, here, junior 
varsity vs FW Country Day, 
5 p.m., junior high vs 
Cisterian, 6:30. 
Thurs., Oct 30, here, Valley 
View vs junior high and 
junior varsity 6:00 and 7:30. 
Thurs., Nov. 6, here, junior 
high vs St. Luke of Irving, 
6:00; junior varsity vs Boyd, 
7:30. 
Thurs., Nov. 13, Both 
'unior games with Notre 
Dame cancelled. 

play with the mighty Valley 
View Eagles. And that's 
how the game went until 
about midway into the 
second quarter, but after 
that the Eagles took over 
and held the Hornets to a 
few scattered first downs 
while adding three touch-
downs to their score. 

The final count was 27 to 
7, whereas it was 7 to 7 in 
the second period. Led by 
the elusive quarterback Alan 
Kassen and hard running 
Paul Nehib, with the help of 
a stalwart line, the Eagles 
broke several big plays 
which made the big dif-
ference. Kassen was the 
game's standout with big 
gainers of 39 and 36 yards 
and consistent short gains, 
plus 2 touchdowns and 2 in-
terceptions. 

For about half of the first 
period the action was all 
defense with one first down 
by each team breaking the 
monotony of five punts 
Then Jerry Serna seemed to 
start something by 
recovering an Eagle fumble 
on the 50, but a pass inter-
ception by Kassen a few 
plays later sparked the first 
Eagle drive. It went 47 yards 
in six plays the big gains 
being 10 and 16 by Nehib. 
The 16 yard run was good 
for the TD. Nehib's kick 
added a point. The score 
was 7-0 at 9:35 in the period. 

Muenster's response was 
is best performance of the 
game. After a kick off  

return to its own 35, Dale 
Swirczynski passed to David 
Flusche for 14 yards. Three 
more plays left them short 
of first down distance by in-
ches, at the 41 of Valley 
View. They decided on a 
fourth down gamble on 
which Swirczynski's fine 
second effort kept the drive 
alive. However a quarter-
back sack and penalty for 
delay spoiled the next series 
forcing a punt. That's when 
fortune stepped in to give 
the Hornets a helping hand. 
The punt was fumbled by a 
receiving Eagle and Flusche 
was there to recover on the 
Eagle 15. Gary Klement 
slipped through the line and 
down to the 2 and scored on 
the next try. Swirczynski's 
kick added a point. The 
score was 7-7 as the clock 
read 6:08 in the second quar-
ter. 

The kickoff that followed 
seemed to continue the Hor-
nets' good luck. Fumbled 
just in front of the goal line, 
it tumbled into the end zone 
and the receiver did a good 
job getting back to the 3, 
where the Eagles still had 
their backs to the goal line. 
But the situation changed 
explosively as Kassen broke 
through and made a broken 
field run of 39 yards to the 
Eagle 43. 

They made the remaining 
57 yards in 9 plays. Big gains 
along the way were Nehib's 
22 and Kassen's pass to 
Wells for 22. Nehib scored 

The Tigers of Sacred 
Heart and the Cardinals of 
Fort Worth Christian 
sloshed out most of two 
quarters on fairly even ter-
ms in last Friday's constant 
drizzle on the SH field. But 
before the half ended the 
Tigers moved ahead by a TO 
and sweetened their lead 
later. The final count was 
27-14, giving Sacred Heart a 
2-2 record for the season to 
date. 

The Cards started with a 
first down on the SH 46 and 
spoiled their next series by a 
pair of penalties. However 
following their kick the 
Tigers had to kick when they 
failed to advance... and 
promptly got a break. Fort 
Worth fumbled the kick. 
Darrell Herr recovered it on 
the Cardinal 35. 

A pass, Mike Nash to 
Brain Bednorz reached the 
15 and four plays later Nash 
circled right and for a 10 
yard touchdown. Nash's 
kick added a point. SH led 
7-0 at 5:51. 

The Cowtown visitors 
lost no time in matching the 
TD. First play after kickoff 
Kevin Walters got around 
left end and raced 70 yards 
to pay dirt. The kick for 
PAT failed. FW trailed 7-6 
at 5:32. 

On the next SH possession 
two short gains plus Kirk 
Mollenkopf's 16 got to the 
Christian 19, but a fumble 
ended the drive suddenly. 
Taylor recovered for the 
Cards, and four plays later 
Bednorz intercepted giving 
SH another opportunity on 
the 19. The next series was a 
dud, losing yardage back to 
the 21 as well as possession. 

Then, suddenly, another 
turnover. Herr recovered a 
fumble on the 24 and the 
Tigers finally cashed in. 
Four tries gained to the 11 
and Nash scored via the left 
end. A run for bonus points 
failed. SH led 13-6 at 11:22 
in the second. 

The Christians came back 
with a fine drive of 35 yards 
to the 29 and Scott went in 
from the 25 three plays later. 
But the score was wiped out 
for holding and the ball set 
back to the 40, where Taylor 

les 27-7 
from the 1 and kicked the 
extra point. Eagles led 14-7 
with 1:10 remaining in the 
half. 

Following 	Muenster's 
only first down of the 
second half, the teams set-
tled down to kicking the ball 
back and forth. On the six-
th punt Muenster fumbled 
and the Eagles were 38 yards 
away. One try gained 2, then 
Kassen's skilled footwork 
cleared him and he breezed 
36 yards to pay dirt. A try 
for extra point failed. The 
score was 20-7 with 43 
seconds remaining in the 
third. 

Following three more kick 
exchanges the Eagles started 
their last drive, this one ap-
parently inspired by an in-
cident of Hornet tough luck. 
MHS recovered a fumble 
but had it nullified by an of-
fside ruling. after which 
Valley View was 53 yards 
from pay dirt. Seven plays 
gained 20 by rushing and 15 
by a pass to Windle to the 
18, but the drive stopped 
abruptly as Coffey 
recovered a fumble, which 
turned out to be only a delay 
in the drive. Three plays 
later Kassen intercepted on 
the 43. Four runs were 
enough from there. Nehib 
made 23, Moses made 15, 
Kassen made 3 then scored 
from the 2. Nehib's kick 
made the score 27-7 as 1:49 
remained. 
Statistics 	M 	VV 
First downs 	6 	14 
Yards rushing 	78 	258 
Yards passing 	57 	35 
Passes compl. 	6-15 	2-3 
Intercept by 	0 	2 
Fumbl. lost by 	2 	3 
Penalties 	6-50 	5-25 

Muenster 
Livestock 
Auction 

SALE EVERY THURSDAY 

We offer our 
service to assist you 
in buying or selling 

of live stock. 

Bill & Mike Hamer 
Phone 759-2201 

booted a perfect punt. It 
went out of bounds on the 1. 
Tigers had their backs to the 
goal, where they fumbled 
the ball away on the third 
play. Stone recovered. 
Alexander scored on the 
next play, and Scott 
followed over for a 2 point 
bonus. The Cards were 
ahead 14-12, their first lead 
of the game. 

However the lead was 
destined to be short. 
Following kickoff the Tigers 
had to kick on second series 
and got back in business whe 
n Curtis Henscheid intercep-
ted three plays later. With 70 
yards to go they promptly 
made a pair of first downs, 
after which a fine pass, Nash 
to John Hartman gained 36 
to the 5. Next play was a pit-
chout, Nash to Mollenkopf, 
for a scoring sprint. The run 
for extra points failed. SH 
led 19-14 seconds before 
half time. 

Back after intermission, 
the Tigers started moving on 
first possession. From their 
26 they gained in two series 
and stalled in the third and 
had to punt. However Har-
tman's fumble recovery gave 
them another start at the 
Cardinal 29. Six plays from 
there produced the TD on a 
pass from Nash to Bednorz 
for 19 yards. A try for bonus 
points failed. SH led 25-14 
at 4:06. 

Junior Varsity teams of 
Valley View and Sacred 
Heart bumped heads in a 
defensive standoff through 
most of the first half before 
the Tigers were able to put 
their game together. Bet-
ween kick exchanges the 
teams had one first down 
each when the visitors un-
corked a 34 yard gain to the 
Tigers 21, and on the next 
play Greg Walterscheid in-
spired his teammates with an 
interception. 

He ran it back to the Tiger 
35, a long 65 yards from the 
end zone, and the Tigers 
made the distance in 13 tries. 
The scoring play was an 18 
yard sweep around end by 
Neil Hesse. A run for bonus 
points failed ending the 
game scoring at 6-0. 

However Sacred Heart 
was extra busy through the 
second half defending the 6 
point lead. Early in the third 
period they fumbled a punt 
giving the Eagles a set-up on 
the 19. However Valley 
View fumbled a short time 
later and SH was in 
possession on the 10. Four 
plays later the Tigers had a 
punt blocked and the Eagles 
were knocking again at the 
19. So Valley View fumbled 
again and Craig Bayer 
recovered for SH. But the 
Tigers still were not out of 
trouble. Eagles intercepted 
and had four more tries 
from the 11. The four tries 

News of the Sick 
Mike Dangelmayr, son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Dangelmayr is home now, 
dismissed from Muenster 
Memorial Hospital to con-
valesce following surgery on 
his broken right leg. 

The Cardinal comeback 
was short, gaining 29 yards 
before the third series had to 
end in a punt. Likewise SH 
responded with gains of 64 
yards, including a major 
penalty and a 43 yard pass, 
Nash to Bednorz, and then 
fumbled, Scott recovering 
for the Christians on the 25. 

At that point a major 
penalty moved them back 
half was to the goal and an 
attempted kick was fouled 
by a high snap from center. 
It resulted in a safety, up-
ping the score to 27-14. 

With 	8 	minutes 
remaining, there still was 
lots of action if not a score. 
Rick Hennigan returned the 
free kick 29 yards to the 
Card 34. 

Tigers kicked on the next 
series and Cards promptly 
made 33 on a pass plus 
another first down and 
fumbled on the third series. 
Hal Mollenkopf recovered. 
Just before the end a nice 18 
yard pass gain was followed 
by Teddy Walterscheid's in-
terception. 
Statistics SH FWC 
First downs 17 10 
Yards rushing 149 164 
Yards passing 151 53 
Passes complete 7-19 4-11 
Intercept by 3 0 
Fumbles lost by 3 3 
Penalties 4-40 10-70 
Punts 5-20 3-24 

gained only 6, so the Tigers 
took possession, made a fir-
st down and kicked out of 
trouble beyond midfield. 
Just before the end Greg 
Walterscheid intercepted 
and SH was moving at the 
final whistle. 

Muenster Hornets had 
ideas last week that by 
giving a super effort and get-
ting a few breaks they could 

54  

Wednesday Night Special 

All You Can Eat 
Fried or Boiled 

Shrimp..$7" 
With salad bar and baked potato 

or French fries 

STEAKS ... SEAFOOD... 
CHICKEN ... BARBECUE 

Rohmer's Restaurant 
Emil and Agnes Rohmer. Muenster 

Clued on Sunday 

JV Tigers Win 6.0 
Over Valley View 



A TRUCK FOR EVERY ROAD 
See the New 81's 

Entry Form 

1980 PP&K Competition in Muenster 

Saturday, Oct. 4 

Name 	  

Age 	 Date of Birth 	  

Parental consent given by 

Please complete and deposit 

In a special box at Hof-

bauer's or turn in at 

the contest. i 
.,...j.".. 

... ,,, s,
e.... • 

1 . 'E 	StOU n )7' 
• :1*.:181."--P ..—fi I *NW 	 -••s 

ON SALE NOW 
Heffley's Wood Heaters 

214-429-6262 or 214-564-3833 

Fireplace Inserts too! .10, 

W.C. Electric 
Specializing in Oil Field 

Electric equipment 
Single phase, three phase & phase converters 

W.C. Muller 	759-4517 

Mobile phone 665-8561 Unit 416 
Home phone 726-3613 

1 POI 

United Electric Service 

Qualit y  W.,4 _ 	p,ice 

C.M. Muller, Harold Alexander 
759-4517 nights & holidays, 637-2330 

Charlotte Fleitman sets it up for Judy Dittfurth in this 
action with the girls from Callisburg. 

Janie Hartman Photo 

°GLASGOW 
Democratic Primary 

Po no Pelv by Boo Gipspop lor Senalo 	
46.5D1P 

P.Ily 	 Po.op ,,,,, pre, P 0 Boo 1250 Slephompile Texas 'POI .71.54825 

Wideside 
• New aerodynamic styling 
• 61/2- or 8-loot cargo box 
• Double-wall construction 
• Gasoline or diesel engines 

available 

Fenderside 
• 2- or 4-wheel drive available 
• Steps for easy side 

loading 
• Gasoline or diesel engines 

available 

• All GMC's are covered by a 3-Year Perforation From Corrosion Limited Warranty. Exhaust 
systems are not included. Ask your GMC dealer for details on other limitations. 

Muenster HOEDEBECK GMC 759-4366 

45-P01 

GMC TRUCKS ARE WHAT WE'RE ALL ABOUT 

Support your team this season! 
The fans make a big difference. 

Sept. 5, Callisburg 
Hornets 	12 	Opponent 

Sept. 12, Nocona 
Hornets 	28 	Opponent 

Sept. 19, Lindsay 
Hornets 	 Opponent 	  

Sept. 26, Valley View 
Hornets 	7  	Opponent 

Oct 3, Sadler Southmayd 
Hornets 	 Opponent 	 

Oct. 10, Era 
Hornets 	 Opponent 	 

Oct. 17, Paradise 
(Homecoming) 

Hot nets 	 Opponent 	 

Oct. 24, Perrin 
Hornets 	 Opponent 	 

Oct. 31, Saint Jo 

ers 
Sept. 5, Petrolia 	 T 8:00 

Tigers 	6 	Opponent 	 21 

Sept. 12, Lindsay 	H 8:00 
Tigers 	I 3 	Opponent 	6  

	

Sept. 19, Valley View 	H 8:00 
o  Tigers 	 Opponent 	

12 

Sept. 26, FW Christian 
Tigers 	27 	 Opponent 	 

Oct. 4, Alvord 	 18:00 
Tigers 

Oct. 11, FW Country Day T 3:00 
Tigers 	 Opponent 	  

Oct. 17, Abilene Christian H 7:30 
Tigers 	 Opponent 	 

	

Oct. 24, L.D. Bell JV's 	7:30 
Tigers 	 Opponent 	  

	

Nov. 1 Tyler Gorman 	H 7:30 
(Homecoming) 

Ttgers 	 Opponent 

H 8:00 
I 3 	 

T 8:00 
7  

T 8:00 

T 8:00 
27  

H 8:00 

H 7:30 

H 7:30 

17:30 

17:30 

H 8:00 
14 

Opponent 	  

Hornets 	Opponent 	 

Nov. 7, Alvord 
Nov. 8, Open 

H 7:30 	Nov. 15, Notre Dame 	12:00 
Hornets  	Opponent_ _ Tigers 	 Opponent 

Muenster Hornets 	Sacred Heart Ti 

   

G & H 
Backhoe 
Service 

759-4130 

759-4304 

Muenster 

    

FRANK 
DUSTIN 

OFFICE & 
SCHOOL SUPPLIES 

665-5594 

COMMUNITY 
LUMBER CO. 

759-2248 

Muenster 

 

CASE 
POWER & EQUIP. 

665-4314 

Gainesville 

ESE 

 

GEHRIG 
Hardware 

and 

iifisrtlreg 
Meat Market 

759-4211 	Muenster 

  

R & J's 
Ranch & Western Wear 

759-4112 

Muenster 

        

THE CENTER 
Restaurant & Tavern 

759-2910 

Muenster 

1:1 FOR—D1 

Endres 
Motor Co. 

759-2244 
Muenster 

H&W 
Meat Co. 
759-2744 

H&W 
Kountry Korner 

Muenster 
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Punt, Pass, & Kick Hornets to Meet Tough S&S Rams on Friday 
Punt, Pass and Kick time 

has arrived for youngsters of 
the community. Their con-
test will be held Saturday, 
Oct. 4, at I p.m. at Muen-
ster High School with the 
Jaycees sponsoring. Claude 
Klement and Jim Endres are 
co-chairmen. 

This is the first time under 
Jaycee sponsorship. For 
many years the program has 
been sponsored nationally 
by Ford Motor Co. and the 
National Football League 
and locally by the Ford 
dealer. This year both the 
national and local sponsors 
have quit and the Jaycees 
took over. 

They are following the 
same rules and regulations 
as before. Six age groups, 8 
to 13 inclusive, are eligible 
and the age as of December 
31 determines eligibility. For 
instance, a boy or girl en-
tering the 8 years age group 
must reach the eighth birth-
day any date this calendar 
year and may actually be 7 
years old on the contest 
date. 

Scoring is done as before. 
Distance of a punt, pass and 
kick, less distance of 
deviation from a center line, 
are measured separately and 
added for the total score. 

Jimmy 
• 2- or 4-wheel drive 

available 
• Radial tires, standard 
• Tinted glass, standard 

The prizes are trophies to 
the first second and third 
place winners of each age 
group. 

Jaycee chapters of North 
Texas are also considering a 
regional contest of winners 
in this week's local contest. 
It is tentatively set for 
Muenster on October 11. 

Tournament 
Postponed 

The 	tournament 
scheduled Sunday by the 
Muenster Golf Association 
has been postponed to Sun-
day, Oct. 12. The problem 
involves current repairs to 
the course after the heavy 
rain. 

The odds are still stacked 
against the MI-IS Hornets as 
they approach an encounter 
with Sadler-Southmayd's 
Rams in the final game of 
their pre-district schedule. 
As revealed to Coach Jerry 
Stinson, the S&S boys are 
big and physical, especially a 
power-running 210 pound 
fullback who is double hard 
to stop. In Stinson's opinion 
the Rams probably cannot 
match Valley View in speed 
and finesse but they will 
have lots of raw power. 

The Rams look equally 
good on paper with a record 
of 3-0-1. They defeated Era 
36-0, Tom Bean 48-6 and 
Saint Jo 12-0. Their other 
score was a 14-14 tie with 
Pottsboro, rated as on of the 
stronger teams of District 
I4-AA. 

By comparison, Muenster 

has a win over Nocona, a tie 
with Lindsay and losses of 
13-12 to Callisburg and 27-7 
Valley View. 

Another factor is the 
Hornet injury record. Of the 
four starters who have been 
sidelined, John Walter-
scheid, Larry Fleitman and 
Ricky Winn are regarded as 
barely possible retur-
nees...more probably not 
ready. Also Bob Hamric is 
still out with the fracture 
received at Lindsay, the 
report of which was botched 
in the Enterprise last week. 
Bob got it in the first scrim-
mage play, not in the 
sideline excitement before 

the game. Also the injury 
was to a foot bone, not the 
leg. And it was minor, 
probably keeping him out of 
only 2 or 3 games. Otherwise 
all players are well and 
ready. 

Despite the handicaps, the 
Hornets and their coach are 
still enthusiastic and con-
fident. Stinson is extra 
proud of their good defense 
and their over all hustle 
against last week's talented 
foe. They're ready for the 
Rams and itching for an up-
set. 

vs 

).00 

 1.00 

 I.00 

1.00  

1980 FOOTBALL SCHEDULE  

HENNIGAN 
Auto Parts, Inc. 

759-2291 

Muenster 

Walterscheid 
Oil Co. 
7592737 

Muenster 

I. 
	 WIMMER 

DIESEL 
SERVICE 

759-2560 
Muenster 

ROHMER'S 
Restaurant 

7592973 

Muenster 
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Good return by Brenda Wimmer in the game with Callisburg. Team mates are 

Carla Walterscheid and Sandy Wimmer. 	 Janie Hartman Photo. 

Tigers Travel to Alvord Saturday 

CME 

CLEANERS 
401 N. Grand 
	

665-4962 
27.001 

Garden Center 
Bulletin 

From now until October 15th is the 
proper time to apply BALAN, a weed 
killer that kills weeds before they 
sprout. It will control winter grass 
and many other fall sprouting weeds 
that cause problems in the spring. A 
repeat application in February will 
control summer weeds like 
crabgrass, grassburrs, dallis grass 
and other summer weeds. 

It's also time to plant your fall 
bulbs and bedding plants. We have 
just received new shipments of both. 
Stop by the Garden Center for all your 
lawn and garden needs. 

Muenster Garden Center 
502 N. Main 	4.3401 

Tuesday, Oct. 7 
111115 SIZE 

WALLET 
CREATIVE 

COLOR 
PORTRAITS 
FOR OWL 

t!'), Kodak paper For a Good Look at the Times 
of Your Life. 

torn 

Charge 

for 

GROUPS 

PIIIV1111.1.01 	 4•111.■ 
(AMOY DO NA •■0 411 11$ 

Intl ow, o ■ ultu 

COINOR 
PHOTOS 

HOFBAUER'S 
Food & Locker 
402 E. Division I Hwy 82 	40 101 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * **  

NO 

LIMIT 

inc. Ab I K0,,,  

IFIRM 
8 a 10 
OFFER 

•6611.11111 e
•IF HIGHWAY 82 	• 

MUENSTER, TEXAS 

Drive-thru Window 
for Your Convenience 

Phone Orders 
759-4512 

N 
••• 

Daily Specials 

Fish 
Sandwich 

$14o 

An Auto Accident 
is a shattering experience. Without insurance, the shock 
can be worse. Don't take a chance on no insurance or 
being underinsured. 

Auto insurance is just one of the Farm Bureau Members' 
insurance needs served at low net cost. 

For this valuable protection or service call your agent. 

TEXAS FARM BUREAU INSURANCE COS. 

Rick Royal, Agency Manager 
Cooke County Farm Bureau 

Gainesville 	Office 817-665-1763 
817-665-1763 	Home 817-665-2352 

eutr FB 
V,/  NIRO IV 	 X Ayr,.  C. 

6 Month Money Market Certificate 
'10,000 Minimum 

11.968% 
Current Annual Rate 

Effective October 2 through October 8. 
Federal regulations prohibit compounding of interest 

on 6•Month Money Certificate 

2 1/2 Year Money Market Certificate 
0 100 Minimum 

12.00% 
Current Annual Rate 

Effective October 2 through October 15 
Interest compounded dally 

Federal regulations require substantial penalty on early withdrawal 

• 
WM/MIS 

AND LOAN ASSOCIATION 

OF BOWIE, TEXAS 

FIRST 

1020 N. Grand 
Gainesville, Texas 

OFFICE: 665-0316 

*sio, 	665 0472 
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With the usual 	com- 
parisons indicating an even 
game, the Tigers are due to 
have an uphill struggle when 
they meet Alvord Saturday 
night. The difference is the 
home field advantage, and 
even more so when the 
Bulldogs are expected to be 
specially fired up for 
homecoming. 

Otherwise the teams 

* * 

U 

U 

U 
U  

ought to be about even, ac-
cording to Virgil Henscheid, 
the Tiger assistant coach. 
Alvord has a 3-0 standing, 
the loss being to Class AA 
Coppell, which rates Alvord 
as a fast arid scrappy outfit. 
Sacred Heart's record is 2-2. 

Other information on the 
teams shows that they are 
about even in size with 
Alvord probably having the 

advantage in speed, par-
ticularly one fleet footed 
halfback who like to get out-
side. Henscheid said his 
boys' first assignment will 
be to prevent the end runs. 

As regards Tiger offense, 
he and Coach Father 
Stephen are optimistic. The 
boys moved consistently 
against Fort Worth 
Christian, and probably 
would have done better in 
better conditions. The rain 
caused trouble in passing, 
making the ball harder to 
throw and to catch. At the 
same time defense did fine. 
Over all, they seem to be all 
set for this week's tussle. 
The coaches are also pleased 
to report that the team will 
be at full strength... still no 
injuries. 

As an accommodation to 
local fans attending the 
game, regular Saturday 
night service in Sacred Heart 
Church will be held at 5 
p.m. instead of 7:30. 

From Page 9... 

Eggs... 
months or longer," notes 
Cawley. 

So he recommends ex-
posing layers to a constant 
daylength by using electric 
lights. Investing in a time 
clock, wiring and bulbs will 
more than pay off in in-
creased production of fall 
and winter eggs when prices 
are highest. Use one clear 60 
watt bulb set 7 to 8 feet 
above the litter for every 200 
square feet of floor space. 

For maximum benefits 
from lighting, confine layers 
to poultry houses overnight, 
adds the specialist. Also, 
clean all light bulbs and 
replace those which are bur-
ned out before Oct. 1. 

Nobel winner 

AUSTIN, Texas (Spl.)—A 
Nobel Prize winner in physics 
will be on The University of 
Texas faculty in 1980-81. 

He is Dr. Steven Weinberg 
of Harvard, who shared the 
Nobel Prize in 1979 for con-
tributions to the theory unify-
ing the weak and elec-
tromagnetic forces, two of the 
four fundamental forces of 
nature. 

Dr. Weinberg has played a 
leading role in the modern 
theory of the strong nuclear 
forces that hold the nucleus of 
the atom together. 

IT HAPPENED 
40 YEARS AGO 

October 4, 1940 
Cooke County's first step 

toward registration of its 
male citizens between the 
ages of 21 and 35 began 
Monday...registration date 
set by President Roosevelt is 
October 16. Personal 
backing of church fund is 
asked by pastor. Two parish 
groups organize for study 
club sessions. Cotton season 
lags though crop is better 
than in previous years. Earl 
Lehnertz enlists in the armed 
forces and leaves for Saint 
Louis, Mo. Leo Sicking and 
Martha Knabe marry. Al 
Hess and Antonia Hundt 
say wedding vows. 

35 YEARS AGO 
October 5, 1945 

Rev. Herman Laux 
arrives as Sacred Heart 
pastor. Farewell tributes 
honor Father Thomas 
Buergler, named pastor at 
Rhineland. Subiaco Alumni 
elects John Mosman 
president. Winter comes for 
premature visit bringing 
temperature of 53 degrees 
and rain to break a long dry 
spell. Anthony Luke returns 
as church organist after four 
years' absence while he was 
in the army. Sister Leonarda 
breaks her left arm. The Ira 
Yeakleys take over 
management of Main Hotel 
Coffee shop. City raises 
water rate for out of city 
customers. Mrs. Joe Starke 
is back at home after un-
dergoing surgery at Sher-
man. Classes at Lindsay are 
recessed for cotton picking. 

Young Eagles 
Beat Juniors 
Muenster's junior high 

game with the Valley View 
kids last week was a 
tragedy...the score being 50 
to 8 favoring the visitors. 

With a skill that was wor-
thy of more advanced 
classification, the future 
Eagles took over the field 
and scored almost at will. 

Muenster eventually got 
on the scoreboard late in the 
fourth period on a 40 yard 
pass play from Ronnie 
Fisher to Jay Mollenkopf, 
after which Fisher got 
around end for the two 
bonus points. 

Muenster 
Pharmacy 
Medical Center 

Building 
817.759-2833 

Paul Arendt Jr. returns to 
Lindsay with service 
discharge after being in the 
ETO for 16 months. 

30 YEARS AGO 
October 6, 1950 

St. Anne's Society spon-
sors drive for clothing and 
toys for Europgan expelees. 
Julius Hess of Lindsay is 
named Gold Star Boy of 
Cooke County for 1950. 
Farmers return to field work 
after long rainy season. 
FHA Chapter elects Lillian 
Vogel president. Wilfred 
Klement is repeat winner in 
grass judging contest spon-
sored by Upper Elm-Red 
Soil Conservation District. 
Day of recollection for 
women will be held here 
Oct. 22. The Claude Can-
nons who live at Nocona will 
move to Muenster soon to 
live on the Cannon Estate 
Farm 

25 YEARS AGO 
October 7, 1955 

Ground Observer Posts 
are organized in Muenster 
and Bulcher. Lions Club 
grosses $779 in broom 
selling campaign for the 
blind. Luncheon meeting 
Friday will start United 
Fund drive. Gerald Walter-
scheid leaves for army 
training. Mrs. Rilla Wyatt, 
74, resident of Marysville 57 
years, dies. Mrs. Callie 
Baumhardt of Duvol, Okla., 
is here for a visit. Lindsay 
Mother's Club elects Mrs. 
Tony Voth president. Sacred 
Heart football queen contest 
gets under way with LaVer-
na Hess, Edna Mae Hoenig, 
Jeanette Haverkamp and 
Joaline Mollenkopf as con-
testants. 

20 YEARS AGO 
October 7, 1960 

Preliminary work begins 
on fund raising campaign 
for Muenster Hospital. City 
asks bids on small fire truck 

Car cooling systems 
need special mixture 
for hot weather care 

COLLEGE STATION — An 
automobile can withstand hot 

summer temperatures if the 
owner provides common sense 
care, says a research engineer 
for the Texas Transportation 
Institute at Texas A&M Uni-
versity. 

"The single biggest neglect is 
the cooling system and Sun 
Belt drivers are the worst of-
fenders," said Rick Tonda 
"Water is not the only coolant.  
The recommended mixture is 
glycol and water." 

He said the mixture matters 
most when temperatures are 
very cold or very hot. 

In the latter instance, the 
right proportion of glycol to 
water raises the boiling point of 
the water, on the average to 
230 degrees in a pressurized 
system. That adds 20 to 30 
degrees to the operating 
range," the engineer said. "The 
owner's manual gives the best 
proportion for the car."  

for rural service. Rosemary 
Hermes of Lindsay 4-H 
Club is state winner in food 
preservation. James Hess 
buys Sinclair station. Sister 
Cordula Flusche, 80, dies as 
result of hip fracture 
sustained Aug. 24...relatives 
attend funeral in San An-
tonio. Broken right leg sends 
Joe Starke to Nocona 
Hospital. Margie Walter-
scheid and Melvin Voth 
marry. The Alphonse 
Hoenigs and Felix Beckers 
return from 24 state trip. 
Father Conrad Herda of 
Clarksville, Ark., is visiting 
in Lindsay, his former 
parish. Death ends short 
critical illness of Sharon Ot-
to, three-year-old daughter 
of the Johnny Ottos. 

15 YEARS AGO 
October 8, 1965 

Local people buy com-
plete issue of hospital bon-
ds. Muenster FFA teams 
take top honors in both 
junior and senior grass 
judging contest at 
Gainesville; Leon Walter-
scheid is top individual. Art 
show here Sunday has varied 
exhibits and draws atten-
dance of 200. Medders hor-
ses win top trophies in 
Oklahoma show. Cecil Wolf 
has army discharge after 
serving in Germany. Mrs. 
Eddie Krahl has surgery. 
Twelve join junior high 
Camp Fire group. Five 
finalists are chosen in Miss 
Muenster contest. Mr. and 
Mrs. Al Hess celebrate 25th 
wedding anniversary. 

10 YEARS AGO 
October 9, 1970 

Both 	schools 	plan 
homecoming programs. 
Local campaign for United 
Fund starts. City and milk 
plant work together on 
sewer problem. Winners are 
announced in PP&K con-
test; 82 boys participate. 

Funeral services are held 
here for daughter of 
Leonard Endreses of 
Oklahoma City. SHH 
freshman class begins 
project of litter collection. 
Mrs. Prentiss Mangum and 
small son join CWO 
Mangum in Hawaii during 
R&R from Vietnam here 
with his wife and sons. Ser-
vices are held at Lindsay for 
Joe Hellinger, 63. Herman 
Martin plans annual Christ-
mas decor at Lindsay. Local 
KCs will observe Columbus 
Day at dinner-dance Saturday: 

Lindsay. Local KCs will ob-
serve Columbus Day at din-
religious service will be held 
Oct. 17. Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Meurer make home 
in Virginia following wed-
ding. Bluebirds elect officers 
at first meeting of group. 
Feast day honors greet 
Father Placidus. Mr. and 
Mrs. Edgar Mages celebrate 
25th wedding anniversary. 
Aubrey Tuggle is appointed 
Chrysler dealer. New 
arrivals; a boy for the Virgil 
Henscheids; a girl for the 
Harvey Lampk ins. 

5 YEARS AGO 
October 3, 1975 

Johnnie and Butch Fisher 
take over ownership and 
management of Fisher's 
Market. Bike riders turn in 
$1347 in pledges for St. Jude 
Children's hospital. Tigers 
blast Trojans 21-0 and Hor-
nets pluck Eagles 21-6. Eight 
MHS students attend career 
day at A&M. Kenya Hale is 
crowned queen of MHS 
homecoming. Hospital 
Auxiliary starts plans for 
annual dance. Jeanne Lynne 
Endres announces 
engagement to Jim Arthur 
Delano of Healdton, Okla., 
Bruno Fleitmans vacation in 
Germany and meet relatives. 
Dr. Richard Endres and Dr. 
Martha Kincaid marry in 
New York. 

YEARS AGO 

* * * * *** * ** ** * * ** * * 
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HARVEST—WHOLE 

Boneless Ham 
5-7 Lb. Avg. Wt. 

68 
LB. 

S 1  

CALIF. SUNKIST VALENCIA 

ORANGES 
LBS.  $ " 

GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Chuck Roast 
x 1 49 

LB. 	• 	
• 

GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Seven Roast 
$ 59 

LB 	• 

AFFI LIATE  

411CHAIS CUSHY CUT 

Loin Pork Chops 	 

	

AIM HO 	IM 

	

O MU 	 F 

[Seedless Grapes 

LB, 39 4 

CALIFORNIA THOMPSON 
'Sparkling Fresh" Produce <  

CILIFOARIS STILL 

Avocados 	 3,,, 0 1" 
INAININGTH 

Bartlett Pears 	„ 39' 
TED 

Delicious Apples 	3:4 98' 
Calif. Peaches 	 L, 49' 
Bell Pepper 	 „ 49' 

$ 1 79 
SHURFIRE VEGETABLE 

OIL 48 OZ. BTL. 

$ 1 79 
(ADMITS ADULT OR CHILD( 

REG ADMISSION 
PRICE • 	03.00 
YOU SAVE $1.21 

$ 1 79 100 COURT TABLETS — Reg. 52.10 

Bufferin ••• 

* 1" 
SHOWER TO SHOWER 0 OZ . 

Body Powder 

11111 $ 2 3 9 

Downy  	'2" 
COWS 

Cleanser 	 '74  39' 
HMV AM CLEANER 

Lysol 	 us, 99' 
DISIAFECTAR SEIM 

Lysol 	 

IONDEN S M SUCFS 

I Lite Line 	 V '1"  
HADEN MD AMMO SLICED 

Amer. Cheese 	 12,:: 5 1" 

79' 

Crest 
REG. OR MINT TOOTH PASTE 

5 OZ. TUBE 79s 
> 	IN HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS  

Arthritis Formula "FRI"  	40% $ 1 " 
Ban Quick Dry Roll-On 	$1 29  

Ban Roll -On Deod.4
11 g -Et. Lugo I a on  $ 1 29 

Body On Tap Shampoo "0'.5702  '1" 
4-Way Nasal Spray tt,r., ,o, '1 19  

SYLA VNIA INSIDE FROST 80, 75, 100 WT. 

LIGHT BULBS 	99° 

MU I HI 

Grape Jelly 
ROCA STYLE 

Plain Chili 	 "1  '1°' 
MTH NH HAMM 

Juice 	 "clf. 79' 
soneitsa01111111161.11$ MI. 

Cookies 	3 14:: '1" 

/1 08 

HMSO 

Nilla Wafers  	83' 
DAYTIME 

Pampers 	  on. '2" 
BUTTERMOUN 24 OZ 

Syrup 	 tie' 

HMG.. 

Era Liquid 	 usi  $329 

DISNWASNIIG DE7IRCER1 

Cascade 	 w. 
FORM UNIIIEN 

MILKY NUT MUMS 2 IALMRSTEMS 

Snack bars 
OHM NINES,ASS7 

Cake Mix  	',V. 89' 
emonoe 

Breakfast Bars 	 '1" 
FIUME ASSY 

Cat Food 	3'::4 1 1°' 
CHEF HIE HITE 

Plates 	 ,eog 88 , 

$ 199 

.10 HO CHARS 14 6 02 

Dog Food 
OFTEHEIH 

Oxydol 	  

0111111101 

Pampers 	  

NSA OMIT. 

Joy Liquid 	 "41 .  1 1" 

Bath Soap  	85' 
STS-02 LIQUID 

Cleaner 	  
SW TAR TILE 

Lysol Spray 	IrR 1 1' 1  
REGALIA 

Lysol 	 0,11 1 1" 

02" 

'2" 

$4 ,,, 

1111 

> FROZEN FOODS DEPT. < 

BANQUET ASSORTED 

Dinners 	",11: 79' 
DAIRY SPECIALS 	< 

Peanut Butter 	180141 19 
JAR 	1 

LE SUEUR MINI 

Sweet Peas 	 49' 

Sausage 	 51  39e 
HUNTS PEELED 

Whole Tomatoes 	,..bot. lac 
CAN %IP RIP 

CRISCO PURE VEGETABLE 

Shortening 	3,t $2" 

HORMEL VIENNA 

Limit 2 Tubes 

PETER PAN — SMOOTH OR CRUNCHY 

AROUND THE WORLD IN '80 
State Fair of Texas 
* * * * ** OCTOBER 3-19 * * 

r0 ; Tomato Catsup 	3:T° 

MARYLAND CLOS 

'1" Coffee "'"'"  
FREEZE DRIED COFFEE 

Tasters Choice 
FREEZE DRIED CHM 

 Tasters Choice 
CHAIN 4 RON 

Tissue 

SPA MLUNCHEON 
MEAT 

L  12 OZ. CAN 99 
FOX DELUXE ASSORTED 

PIZZA 
";  11-11.5 OZ. 7 

PACKAGE  

0600 HUH 

Towels 

STATE FAIR OF TEXAS 

DISCOUNT TICKETS 

WITH EACH $5.00 PURCHASE EXCL. CIGARETTES 

I DEL MONTE—CREAM OR FAMILY STYLE 

3  17 OZ. $ 
CANS 

1 00 
Golden Corn 

MORTON—ASSORTED 

POT PIES 
4.8 oz. $ II 00 

PEGS. 

SHURFINE 	 1 

Cane Sugar 

BAG 
LB. $ 78 

LIMIT 1 PER FAMILY WITH MINIMUM $10,00 PURCHASE 

Boston 

SWIFT'S TEND'R LEAN I Pork Roast 
Butt $ I 08 

LB. 	MI 

u..  $100 

SILVER SIVA RIIIDIESS SLAB 

.iin 	Sliced Bacon 	 .9101 

,,,,.,,,,,.,.., 64.64.2 Ill.,.. 

. 6 1" 	Sliced Meats 	un't 1 1" 
S li. Bacon ""'"11111" 	 IL. FIG 	 IN 

This Week's SilverStone Feature Piece 

12" Covered Chicken Fryer 

• 1" SWIFTS 1.101 LEAR ROSTON 

Pork Steak 
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NIN 
$149 L. 

Forestburg Club 
The Forestburg 4-H Club 

held its first meeting of the 
school year on September 
10, in the library. Seventeen 
members attended, in-
cluding five new members: 
Krista Shults, Micki Moore, 
Lisa Hamric, Danna Hamric 
and Brenda Hall. Two adult 
leaders, Cleo Lanier and Sue 
Sirman and Montague 
County Extension Agent, 

Imogene Evans and County 
Agent Raford Pullen also at-
tended. 

New officers were elected 
as follows: Leann Hays 
president; Veronica Edwar-
ds vice president, Janice 
Lanier secretary-treasurer; 
Page 	Sirman 	reporter; 
Jackie 	Farrell 	council 
delegate; and Tara Romine 
recreation and refreshment 
chairman. 

New programs were 
discussed and appointments 
were made. Meeting dates 
were set for the second 
Wednesdays of the month. 
Mrs. Cleo Lanier furnished 
refreshments. 

Muenster Club 
The Muenster Com- 

munity 4-H Club opened its 
current year with a meeting 
in the Muenster Public 

School on September 16 at 
3:30 p.m. with 22 members 
attending. John Zimmerer, 
president, led the business 
meeting. 

Members signed up for 
the roller skating project 
and the Foods and Nutrition 
project. They planned a 
Family Night for October 4 
at 7 p.m. in the Cooke 
County Electric Co-op 
Building. 

They made plans for 

future 	programs 	and 
brought permanent records 
up to date. 

Elected to lead the Muen-
ster Community Club in 
1980-81 were: John Zim-
merer president; Shelley 
Zimmerer vice president; 
Andy Burnette secretary; 
Dana Dankesreiter 
songleader; Michelle Kleiss 
and Wayne Becker 
recreation 	leaders; 	Carl 
Zimmerer council delegate; 

and Amy Davidson repor- 
ter. 

Hostesses 	were 	Mrs. 
Burnette and Mrs. Zim- 
merer. The next meeting will 
be on October 21. 

Founded in 1565 by Pedro 
Menendes de Aviles, 
St. Augustine, Fla., is the 
oldest permanent settlement 
in the U.S. 

1980 	PAGE THIRT11-.^. 

Cub Scout 
News 

Two meetings were held by 
Cub Scouts of Den 1. The 
September 2 meeting was in 
the home of den leader, 
Joyce Abney. Seven mem-
bers 	attended 	including 
Jason Walterscheid, Chris 
Tate, Rodney Knabe, Bryan 
Kleiss, James Hennigan, 
David Rohmer and Michael 
Abney and assistant leader 
Sandra Hennigan. The 
theme and study was 
"Communications." 
Refreshments were provided 
by Mike Abney. 
On Monday, September 15, 

seven members made a field 
trip to Radio Station 
KVLH. They were Chris 
Tate, Rodney Knabe, Bryan 
Kleiss, James Hennigan, 
Michael Abney, Marshall 
Smith and Jason Walter-
scheid; and leaders Joyce 
Abney and Sandra Hen-
nigan and a special guest 
Mrs. Kathy Tate. Great fun 
was taping their recitation of 
the Cub Scout Promise and 
then hearing it on the radio 
on the way home. 
Refreshments were provided 
by James Hennigan. The 
boys practiced their closing 
ceremony for the Pack 
meeting on September 22, 
when the 8 members of Den 
I will be eligible to receive 
their Bobcat Badges. 

Cub Scouts, Den 4 

Den 4 held a regularly 
scheduled meeting on 
Tuesday, September 16 in th 
home of Den leader Lupe 
Evans. In the absence of 
denner Jason Brogdon, Don 
Joe Park, assistant denner 
opened the meeting with the 
Pledge of Allegiance and a 
song. 

Den 4 made plans to par-
ticipate in the opening 
ceremony of the Pack 
meeting and to present a skit 
on "Communications." 
Rehearsals were held during 
the meeting. 

They also heard Randall 
Bowen of Denton speak on 
"Fire Prevention" and saw 
a brief movie. He is a 
representative of the Master 
Guard fire alarm system. 
Refreshments were brought 
by Sharon Walterscheid and 
served by Don Joe Park. 
Den 4 members attending 
were Don Joe Park, Jeff 
Walterscheid, Johnny Herr, 
Joseph Shane Wimmer and 
Murlin Evans. Jason 
Brogdon was absent. The 
next meeting will be on Oc-
tober 6. 

Energy Facts 

Did you know that.. . 

One barrel of oil contains 42 

gallons. Forty six percent of a 
barrel of crude goes for motor 

gasoline; 26 percent for light fuel 
for home heating and diesel oil; 

six percent for aviation jet fuel; 10 
percent for residual fuel for 

utilities, industry, large apartment 
buildings, and office buildings: 

two percent for propane, and 10 
percent for all other petroleum 

products. 

Forty states already have 

enacted their own legislation 
pr
o
oviding property, sales, or in- 

cmc tax breaks for homeowners 
installing solar equipment. 

Alaska's pipeline is now 
providing the U.S. with 1.4 million 

barrels of oil a day. The contribu-
tion from the pipeline could rise to 

about two million barrels a day. 

Each day, the average American 

uses the energy from 16 pounds of 
coal, 3.6 gallons of oil, 240 cubic 

feel of natural gas, T.8 kilowatt 
hours of hydroelectric power. and 

3.5 kilowatt hours of nuclear 
power. 
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4-H Club News 

NAHIST 12-4 M.o. WI.) 

Ham Halves 	 

Smoked Picnics 	 
FREER E110110 URGE NEM 

Spare Ribs 
TYSON VIDA OM "A" PUY 

Fryer Breast 	 
TESSA DSOS RITE "1' HIM 

Drumsticks 	 
13.1 COMM 

Bologna 
OSCAR IntlMIEURS 

Beef Franks 	 
DSC. WEN SLICED 

Ham & Cheese 

L.  $178 

OSCAR MITER 

Seven Steak 	 

go 'upnleriwiss Steak 
HAM HO NEA. IEFi 

.99' 
	

Shoulder Arm Roast 

78° 	
Lain 

	Steak 	 '2" 
YOURS 

11. '1 2 ' 	Country Sausage 	..'1" 

u. sus 

'47:  79' Franks  	63' 

' '1" 	Brauns Roll 	 

	'41: 1 1" Chopped Ham 
OSCAR HIEN SLIM 

rms. ASH GRADE "I' 

Fryer Thighs 	.0 1" 

Fischers German Smoked Sausages 	.111.*1°9 

Pork Liver  
	

LB. 29' 

AF. All Meat Corn Dogs 	 10 CT '1" 
Swift's Sizzlean Sliced Bacon 	1205.  '1" 

FINEST QUALITY MEATS AT LOWEST PRICES 

Pork Chops 
ISCNERS MTH CUT AM 

Pork Chops 	 . 1 1" 

W. 79' 	with each and every 
$10 purchase all week. 
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Butch and Johnny Fisher 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * 
We at Fischers Market want to 

congratulate the two football teams of 
Muenster, The Muenster Hornets and 
Sacred Heart Tigers. 

At Muenster High congratulations go 
to John Walterscheid, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Walterscheid and Larry Fleitman 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Fleitman. John 
plays tackle and Larry plays center. Both 
boys are Seniors this year. 

At Sacred Heart congratulations go to 
Brian Bednorz, son of Mr. and Mrs. Nor- 
bert Bednorz and Kirk Mollenkopf, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. George Mollenkopf. Brian 
plays split end and Kirk plays fullback. 
Both boys are Seniors this year. 

* * * * * * 



Now 
at HESS FURNITURE 

MCI 

set  • cash rebate oast from Oeheral ellectrle when you buy 
.01ecla0 appliances el retell frees October 1 Otto n November 30, 1960 

Heavy duty washer has 3 wash/spin 
speed combinations. 2 cycles, including 
permanent press/polyester knits. 
• •...:kr.,r1,wo temperature ccrubln.lont, With enorey 64,1 ■ 4j o.old vailuz 

select.. Another energy saver 	 the occlusive Iglni-Beeket-  tut ,  
23% lees not water and 	

the 
Price 	$399 

,,leantly leas detergent than 	 yen pixyno 	 $379 • • • 1,1g tub's lower water setUng 	 a. as 	 $20  table water levels 

Yaw rano 359 
Own 

 Mueneler 

HESS FURNITURE 
Lan.  "We 755445 what what we sell". 

* * * * * * * * 
German Food, Beer & Polka Music 

* * * ** * * * 
HORSESHOE TOURNAMENT 

* ** * * * * * 
9 Mile KRAUT RUN 

** * ** * * * 
Contests For 

Longest Distance Traveled By Visitors 
Best German Costume 

* * * * * * * * 

--4"%itt 

Come see the NEW 81 's 
The New World Car 

The All New 
FORD 
GRANADA 

     

     

Endres Motor Co. 
Muenster 759.2244 
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THE 700 CLUB TV SHOW 
WITH PAT ROBERTSON. 

The internationally syndicated 700 
Club TV show hosted by Pat 
Robertson is an exciting, upbeat 
blend of music, news and Inter-
views with people whose lives 
have been dramatically changed . 

Guests include sports celebrities, 
entertainers, government leaders 
and educators, all with a dynamic, 
Christian perspective. Millions 
across America are discovering the 
bright new outlook of the 700 Club. 

WATCH THE TV SHOW 

THAT CHANGES LIVES. 

energy answers 

Evenings 

On Channel 39 

from the Texas Energy Extension Service 

Can you explain how a solar 
water heater works? T. R., 
Tyler. 

In order to understand the 
operation of a solar water 
heater, it is helpful to under-
stand the mechanics of an 
electric water heater, since 
the two are similar. 

In the case of a standard 
electric water heater, turning 
on a "hot" water faucet in the 
house causes cold water to 
enter the tank. A sensor with-
in the tank determines when 
the water temperature drops 
and activates an electric heat-
ing element. The element 
heats the water to the desired 
temperature (120 degrees F to 
140 degrees F) and shuts off. 

A solar water heater, how-
ever, has two temperature 
sensors with the second one 
located at the collector panel. 

As the sun heats the panel 
to a temperature higher than 
that of the water in the tank, 
the circulating pump turns on 
to force the cooler water up 
to the panel. After it is 
heated, it flows back into the 
tank. When the water in the 
tank reaches the indicated 
temperature, the pump shuts 
off. 

The process continues as 
long as the panel is hot 
enough to raise the water 
temperature. At night or dur-
ing periods of extreme 
cloudiness, the electric heat-
ing element takes over. 

Collector panels and 
plumbing must be protected 
against freezing during cold 
winter months. The most fre-
quently used methods are the 
drain down system where wa- 

From Page One 

Confetti.. 
highlighted by the infamous 
Panama Canal giveaway. 
Carter and Associates have 
fenagled to give this vital 
economic and security in-
stallation to a fanatic 
enemy, who is dedicated to 
the communist goal of 
destroying US and the rest 
of the free world... and they 
arranged to make us pay the 
enemy for accepting it. 
Three fourths of the country 
violently opposed the deal 
but was over ruled... and all 
should remember on elec-
tion day. 

Only slightly less disgrace-
ful was our betrayal of 
Taiwan at the insistence of 
the Chinese Communists. 
They said we could not deal 
with them without stabbing 
an old friend in the back, and 
Carter agreed to stab. He 
showed the world that 
America's word to an ally is 
meaningless. 

Likewise he cooperated 
with red revolutionaries in 
overthrowing Rhodesia and 
countries of Central 
America but has assisted the 
Reds in constantly trying to 
destroy Chile, which upset 
its dictator and restored 
freedom. Carter's record 
has been to double cross the 
world's few remaining free 
countries and assist the 
spread of global corn-
munisim. As the leader of 
the world's foremost free 
country he has been a failure 
and a disgrace. 

Another issue that needs 
consideration this year is the 
country's moral decay. The 
Democratic campaign 
machine has been mean 
mouthing the fundamen-
talist movement for its ef-
forts to bring religion into 
politics, but millions of 
people know this isn't really 
the issue. It's not a matter of 
enhancing the influence of 
any one denomination, but 
simply to bring back original 
American respect for God 
and morality. The fun-
damentalists are people 
from all creeds whose con-
cern is to elect people of 
their own conviction. Our 
sincere hope is that they will 
help elect Reagan and con-
tinue the good work in 
future elections. 

We hope this will be the 
beginning of phasing evil 
out of our society: the graf-
ters in government; the 
thieves and murderers and 
rapists who prey on society; 
the gays and pornographers 
and abortinists whose life 
style is an abomination to 
God and a ruination to the 
country. 

How does this concern the 
election? Well the 
homosexuals and sex 
glorifiers and abortionists 
are the people who, by 
Democratic manipulation, 
took over the White House 
Conference on Families. 
These moral lepers, with 
Carter's approval, are trying 
to impose their immoral 
principles as the guidelines 
of American family life. 
And still the party leaders 
have the nerve to criticize 
the fundamentalists for their 
effort to restore morality. 

Schedule 
of Meetings 

*Jaycees 
Oct. 2 

Muenster Jaycees will 
meet Thursday, October 2 at 
8 p.m. in the K.C. Hall. 

First Monday 

Meetings scheduled for 
Monday, Oct. 6 are the 
Muenster Boy Scouts, the 
Myra Volunteer Fire Depar-
tment and the Hood Com-
munity Improvement Club. 

New Extension 
. Homemakers Club 

The new Muenster Exten-
sion Homemakers Club will 
meet Tuesday, October 7 at 
4 p.m. in the home of 
Sharon Walterscheid. The 
program will be on silk 
flower arranging. Meetings 
are open to anyone and new 
members are always 
welcome. 

YHT 
Muenster YHT members 

are notified that their 
meetings are set for the 
second Thursday of the 
month. The October 
meeting will feature a 
program on Household 
Banking and Budgeting by 
John David Meurer. It will 
be held in the MHS 
Homemaking Dept. at 7:30 
p.m. on October 9. 

CDA 
Catholic Daughters of 

America will meet Thur-
sday, October 9 at 7:30 p.m. 
in the K.C. Hall. 

Folder Shows 
Texas Rocks 
and Fossils 
Rock collectors in Texas 

will be inspired to add to 
their collections after seeing 
a new publication prepared 
by the Travel and Infor-
mation Division of the State 
Department of Highways 
and Public Transportation. 

Entitled "Texas Rocks & 
Fossils," the folder pictures 
nearly 100 specimens in 
vivid color. Each is iden-
tified by its county or region 
of origin. 

Similar in style and for-
mat to the popular "Flowers 
of Texas" folder, the new 
publication is designed for 
the layman rather than the 
professional collector. It 
relates helpful suggestions 
for the amateur rockhound, 
along with admonitions 
about unauthorized collec-
ting. 

The folder also includes a 
small map that divides Texas 
into seven general areas 
based on the relative age of 
the surface geology of each 
region. 

"Texas Rocks & Fossils" 
is available free at any Texas 
Tourist Bureau or by mail 
from Texas, Dept. DHT, 
P.O. Box 5064, Austin, 
Texas 78763.  

ter drains from the panels 
when near-freezing tempera-
tures occur and the closed 
loop system which uses an 
anti-freeze solution (separat-
ed from household water by a 
heat exchange device) in the 
exposed areas. 

These and other questions 
on solar water heaters are 
answered in "Solar Water 
Heaters — Consumer Tips 
and Information," a pub-
lication available free from 
the Texas Energy Extension 
Service. To obtain a free copy 
contact the Texas Energy Ex-
tension Service, Center for 
Energy and Mineral Re-
sources, Texas A&M Universi-
ty, College Station, Texas 
77843. 

My husband and I are very 
interested in solar and wind 
energy and their uses in this 
area. What information does 
the Energy Extension Service 
have on solar and wind? B. W., 
Beeville. 

The Energy Extension 
Service has available free 
packets of general informa-
tion on the domestic use of 
solar energy and wind ener-
gy. Information in the two 
packets is varied but includes 
bibliographies, short articles, 
and lists of manufacturers, 
designers, and distributors 
where appropriate. 

If you have a question about 
energy conservation around 
the home, send it to ENERGY 
ANSWERS, Texas Energy Ex-
tension Service, Texas A&M 
University, College Station, 
Texas 77843. 

SLOW DOWN 

THEY DEPEND ON YOU 

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home 

759-4422 
.001 

Enjoy "Gemuetlichkeit" 
Good Fellowship — German Style! 

Rain Brings Rainwaters 
With the weekend rains came the Rain-

waters, Gary, Teresa, Travis and 
Heather, that is, who arrived Sunday afer 
a six hour drive in the rain. He's the new 
district conservationist of the Soil Con-
servation office and they are the city's 
newest residents. If only they had come in 
July! 

VOTE 

KENNETH MAC FITTS 
Honest and Reliable 

REPUBLICAN 

FOR 

SHERIFF 
Cooke County Texas 

313-0010 

Paul poldIsal ad Osid tor tax Kenneth Mac Fitts 

P 0 Box 1245 Gemes,11e, Texas 76240 

SUNDAY, OCTOBER 5, 1980 
NOON TO MIDNIGHT 

in the Lindsay Park, Lindsay, Texas 
Rain or Shine 

1-35 North to W. 82, then 4 miles west. 
NO ADMITTANCE CHARGE---EVERYONE WELCOME! 

Free Parking 
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