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Congressman Omar Burle­
son, in his report this week 
to the 17th Congressional Dis­
trict, tells us that “a good 
thing has happened in Wash­
ington — the Land Use Plan­
ning Act was defeated by a 
vote of 211 to 204.”

The margin there is too 
close for comfort. It’s depress­
ing to think that the propor­
tion in congress favoring this 
kind of bureaucratic rule is 
that high. And it also makes 
us wonder whether the act’s 
supporters may pick up a few 
votes and bring up the pro­
position again.

Burleson comments that the 
Land Use Planning Act is 
much like the Environmental 
Protection Act. Its proposals, 
like motherhood and patrio­
tism, are most desirable, but 
the rules and red tape by 
which they are to be attained 
violate our free enterprise 
system besides shifting more 
responsibility from local and 
state government to the fed­
eral bureaucracy, which al­
ready wields too much power.

The EPA measure went 
through as a Mr. Clean pro­
posal. Who could object to 
clean air, clean water, clean 
everything? So it was ap­
proved, but has since been 
twisted by rules and regula­
tions into an oppressive force 
haunting individuals and en­
tire communities.

A sample of its operation 
is noted in Houston where 
economic sanctions are threat­
ened on the whole city in or­
der to reduce pollution by es­
tablishing buses and car pools. 
EPA ordered firms with 1,000 
or more employee to reduce 
parking spaces and force 
workers to pay a fine of $1.00 
per day plus a fee for driving 
to work.

Other major cities are con­
fronted with an edict to elimi­
nate downtown parking by 
denying license plates for 
cars with excess emission, and 
curtailing construction of any 
kind of facilities which might 
add to air pollution. Cities 
trying to revitalize their 
downtown areas find EPA 
blocking construction and en­
forcing anti parking rules. 
Like a dictator it exercises 
the powers of police, judge 
and jury.

In fact, EPA's power is al­
ready so extensive that it 
overlaps the proposed Land 
Use Planning Act. It claims 
that it has the final decision 
to approve new construction 
of building, roads, streets, 
parking lots, garages, shopping 
centers, recreational areas ,  
parks, stadiums, airports and 
any other commercial or in­
dustrial development. Few if 
any important business de- 

* cisions can be made without 
the EPA approval.

While it's true that we need 
to be concerned about pollu­
tion, it’s equally true that the 
country is harmed more than 
helped when Washington be­
comes too solicitious about 
our welfare. Some of the con­
ditions demanded by EPA are 
extreme, requiring far more 
corrective measures than we 
need or can afford. Some sim­
ply hold up progress while 
cantankerous bureaucrats try 
to make up their minds.

EPA demonstrated its meth­
od as well as its value in 
bringing on the national en­
ergy crisis. For lack of its OK 
the Alaska pipe line could not 
be built and the North Slope 
oil field stood idle. Likewise 
offshore drilling and nuclear 
construction were held up.

The circumstances indicate 
very clearly that we’re getting 
a lot more government than 
we need or deserve. What the 
country needs instead of more 
laws and regulations, which 
presumably are doing things 
for us, is the elimination of 
those dictatorial edicts which 
do things to us.

That situation seems to pre­
vail in everything in which 
the government is involved. 
The various agencies were es­
tablished to help the public, 
but invariably they can’t 
function without administra­
tors who push the people 
around. It’s enough to convince 
a person that our lawmakers 
ought to be eliminating some 
of the burdensome regulations 
instead of adding more. We’re 
looking forward to the time 
when Congressman Burleson 
can say that a good thing 
happened in Congress — some 
of those burdensome and dic­
tatorial bureaucratic regula 
tions were repealed.

Honestly, doesn't it seem 
that we could have more free­
dom and happiness and secur­
ity if we could just brush off 
the conglomerations of bene- 
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Pool Will Start Annual 
Swim Classes Next Week

The time for Muenster’s an- 
n u a 1 swimming instruc­
tion arrives next Monday 
with registrations, for the 
junior and senior )ife saving 
courses. There will be a week 
of teaching those classes, then 
a free week before starting 
the annual courses for begin­
ning, intermediate and ad­
vanced swimmers.

Next week’s life saving 
classes will have Jo Ann 
Fagel as supervisor and Kathy 
Luke as assistant. Monday, 
the first day, will be taken up 
with registrations beginning 
at 9 o’clock and classes will 
be held Tuesday through Sat­
urday from 9 to 12 a.m. Pros­
pective students are reminded 
that they will need application

City Council Had | Work Due Soon
A Short Meeting

Gene Luke Gets 
PhD at N. Texas

Dr. Eugene C. Luke received 
a PhD degree in College 
Teaching English last week at 
North Texas State University 
upon acceptance of his dissert­
ation on ‘‘Teaching Under­
graduate Adults in English.” 

To celebrate the event Dr. 
and Mrs. Luke were honorees 
at a party in their home in 
Denton last Friday night for 
friends of the college and 
their parish and out of town 
relations. Included were pres­
ent and farmer Muenster peo­
ple, the Tony, Bill. Harold and 
Bernard Lukes, Father Eu­
gene Luke, The R. N. Fettes, 
Gene Hartmans, John Ayteses 
and Melvin Herrs.

In July Dr. Luke will be­
gin his new assignment as 
Program Specialist in English 
at Northland Pioneer College 
in Holbrook, Ariz. He and his 
wife and two children will 
move there during the sum­
mer.

Former degrees are a BA 
in Physics at NTSU in 1961 
and a MST in English at Wis­
consin State U. in 1968. He 
was a teacher at Lewisville 
High, University of Minnesota, 
University of Wisconsin and 
University of Northern Iowa.

forms with a doctor’s signa­
ture to indicate physical fit­
ness and a parent’s signature 
to indicate permission. The 
junior class is for children 
who are 11 or older or have 
finished the fifth grade. The 
senior class is for those who 
reached 15 years or finished 
the ninth grade.

The big program, which 
usually has 250 to 300 students, 
begins with registrations on 
Monday, July 8. Students en­
rolling then will be split in^o 
two groups, one receiving in­
struction July 9 through 13 
and the other July 15 through 
19. And each class day is di­
vided into three 1 hour per­
iods from 9 to 12. By that 
schedule each child will re­
ceive five hours of instruction.

The course which is con­
ducted by the Cooke County 
Red Cross Chapter, will be 
supervised by Mrs. Polly 
Lewis of the county chapter 
and directed by Mrs. Jeannine 
Flusche.

Others on the staff are ten 
who have the Red Cross rat­
ing of Water Safety Instructor 
and they will be assisted by 
advanced swimmers who have 
the senior life saver rating. All 
of the instruction staff will 
have an orientation meeting 
at 9 a.m. July 2 to get orga­
nized for the swim classes.

The WSI rated teachers are 
Carol Henscheid, Dorma Flu­
sche, Kathy Luke, Kathy 
Berres, Jo Ann Pagel, Carolyn 
Bayer, Wanda Reiter, Karen 
Wilde, June Stoffels and Jean- 
nine Flusche.

The usual application form 
will be required to register for 
the swim classes. It must have 
the parent’s sigature to indi­
cate permission and a doctor’s 
signature to indicate fitness. 
The form is supplied here for 
any who wish to clip it. Others 
will be available at the doc­
tors’ offices and the Enter­
prise.

Eligibility to enroll for the 
lessons is limited to children 
who have completed kinder­
garten. And there will be a 
special class for adult women.

The city council meeting 
Monday night was cut short 
because of the absence of two 
members. The other members 
decided to wait for full attend­
ance to take up the matter of 
tax equalization and the mat­
ter of a permit for construc­
tion of a club house by St. 
Joseph’s Club.

Another subject, on clearing 
the way for construction of 
Ash Street along the west city 
limit, remained dormant until 
a legal hassle will determine 
whether the city or an oil 
lease is responsible for moving 
rod lines. Both sides now 
have legal representation and 
expect to settle the affair 
soon.

About the only things ac­
complished were approval to 
send a fireman to the annual 
Firemen’s Training School at 
Texas A&M, and payment of 
bills.

NEWS
OF THE SICK

Local Boy Scouts 
W ill Leave Sunday 
For Summer Camp

Boy Scouts of Muenster 
are looking forward eagerly 
to next week when they will 
have their annual summer 
camp at the Sid Richardson 
camp on Lake Bridgeport.

They will leave in a group 
from the KC hall at 12:30 
Sunday and will return home 
the following Saturday. Adult 
leaders who will take their 
turns with the boys are Scout­
master Wilfred Reiter, Charles 
Bartush and Dan Luke — and 
more volunteers are welcome.

Boys are reminded to make 
sure that they have their ad­
mission forms ready w h e n  
they gather for the departure 
Sunday. The form combines a 
doctor’s report on physical ex­
amination and the parents’ 
permission.

Camp activity will feature 
outdoor living and work on 
merit badges. Each troop takes 
its turn at cooking for all of 
the boys.

Three Muenster golfers in 
creased their supply of balls 
at the Nocona municipal 
tournament last Sunday af 
ternoon. Father Placidus on 
the second place team won 15. 
Paul Walterscheid and Len 
Entires on teams tying for 
third, received 8 each. About 
ten other Muenster golfers 
were in the tourney.

Mrs. Harry Scoggins is back 
at home released from Metho­
dist Hospital in Dallas last 
Wednesday after two and a 
half weeks of medical care 
and observation and is now an 
out patient of the hospital.

On Paving Job
More paving is on schedule 

here for this summer, and the 
work will probably start the 
second week of July.

City Superintendent Steve 
Moster said Tuesday that Jim 
Foster of Wichita Falls was 
here to discuss finishing the 
project that was not finished 
last year, as well as to take 
care of a number of repair 
jobs.

The program consists most­
ly of resurfacing Maple from 
4th to 6th, at the hospital, and 
Sixth from Pecan to Hi£kory, 
in front of the cemetery. Also 
there’s the job of filling in the 
gap between pavement and 
new curbing that was installed 
at the public school.

Other repair work in sight 
is an area on South Sycamore, 
one on North Cedar, and one 
on Maple.

That much has priority 
rating, after which the city 
will have to consider its fin­
ances as well as the urgency 
of other paving wants.

Hesperian Savings 
Opens Office Here

Hesperian Savings, which 
has served Cooke County for 
84 years in its savings and 
loan business will open an of­
fice in Muenster next Mon­
day.

Edwin E. Wright, president 
has announced completion of 
a lease for the former Cooke 
County Electric Co-op build­
ing, 501 Division Street (Hwy. 
82 East) as the site for the 
firm’s new local office. “We 
are now completing all ar­
rangements to o p e n  our 
Muenster office and expect to 
be open for business on June 
24, Wright said.

Doris Hamer, a Muenster 
resident and seven year em­
ployee of Hesperian Savings 
will be the office manager. 
She said, “It will be an inter­
esting experience for many of

Joe Lutkenhaus, 96, was dis­
missed from Muenster Hos­
pital Monday after being a 
patient several days. Hfe had 
fallen at his home fortunate­
ly sustained no breaks just 
bruises.

Miss Angela Laake was dis­
missed from Muenster Hos­
pital Friday after being a 
medical patient ten days. She 
was - returned to Hillcrest 
Manor Nursing Home.

Bill Haverkamp is out and 
around, dismissed from Meth­
odist Hospital in Dallas.

Mrs. Ben Luke was dis­
missed from Muenster Hos­
pital Friday. She was ad­
mitted May 26 after breaking 
her right, hip and right wrist 
in a fall. She had surgery for 
the hip and has her arm in a 
cast.Building Notes

Muenster and its surround­
ing area is in the middle of a 
big building boom. At this 
time thirteen new homes are 
under construction and ten 
others are recently finished. 
At the same time work con­
tinues steadily on the Sacred 
Heart Parish community cen­
ter, and more than a dozen 
remodel or repaint jobs are 
either under way or finished 
lately.

Biggest project on the list 
is the community center, un­
der contract for $386,944 to 
Jack Owens of Gainesville. 
It’s a white brick structure 
measuring 95x137, is due to 
be finished by the end of this 
year. Outside walls, steel work 
and roof are complete and in­
side work is moving nicely. 
It’s east of the old parish hall 
which will be removed to 
make room for a parking lot.

Newest of the new homes 
are those of Mrs. Charles 
Fisher, W a y n e  Klement, 
Henry Starke, Victor Rohmer 
and H. B. Prather, all of whom 
are just started or just finished 
on the foundation.

Mrs. Charles Fisher on 
North Elm is building a two 
bed room brick veneer house 
with one bath, attached gar­
age, heating and cooling.

Henry Starke, on West 
Ninth, and Wayne Klement, 
north of town, will both have 
three bedroom homes with 
two baths, brick veneer, dou­
ble garage, central heat and 
air conditioning.

Victor Rohmer, on West 
Third is building a two bed­
room home with one bath, 
carport, brick veneer, central 
heating and cooling.

H. B. Prather, near Rosston, 
is building a three bedroom 
house with two baths, at­
tached garage, brick veneer 
and central heat and air.

Tommy Knabe, s'outhwest 
of town adjoining Ben Voth, 
is at the framework stage on 
his new home. It will have 
four bedrooms, two baths, 
double garage, brick veneer, 
central heating and air con­
ditioning.

Bob Steele Quits SHHS 
To Coach at Collinsville

Robert Steele, athletic coach 
at Sacred Heart School for the 
past two years, announced 
last week that he has resigned 
the position to accept the 
coaching job at Collinsville 
High School.

As a result the community 
now is looking for two coaches. 
The other vacancy developed 
a week earlier when Glenn 
Richardson quit at the public 
school to go into the sporting 
goods business.

Up to this time successors 
have not been named at either 
school. Father Placidus Eck- 
art, superintendent at Sacred 
Heart, said Monday that no

Just beyond the city limits 
brothers Bill and F r e d  
Koerschner, airline pilots, are 
building. Bill, with Delta, is 
on a ten acre tract at the 
southwest comer of town. His 
home features five bedrooms, 
three baths, basement, fire­
place, double garage, brick 
veneer, heat and air. It’s due 
to be ready for the parents 
and three boys and one girl 
to move in about August 1 

Fred’s is just well started. 
Located on five acres just 
s&uth of the city and adjoining 
Bill, he will have five bed­
rooms, three baths, double 
carport, brick veneer, fire­
place, central heating and cool­
ing. Until finished the parents 
and four sons are occupying 
the Wayne Traohta house.

Amie Wimmer is currently 
at the roofing stage of his new 
three bedroom home with two 
baths, double garage, central 
heat and cool, brick veneer.

Alvin Fleitman, southeast of 
Myra, is nearing completion 
on his home with three bed­
rooms, two baths, double gar­
age, brick veneer, heat and air.

Also nearly finished is Sam 
Sparkman just beyond the 
northwest city limit. He’s 
building two bedrooms, a bath, 
central heating and cooling, 
brick veneer.

Dennis Hofbauer is starting 
inside work at his new home 
on the Clem Hofbauer farm 
across the road from Charley 
Heilman’s farm. It features 
three bedrooms, two baths, 
double garage, fireplace, cen­
tral heat and cool, brick ven­
eer.

Jerry Waltercheid, about 4 
miles northeast of town, has 
reached the cabinet work 
stage. He will have three bed­
rooms, two baths, double gar­
age, central heating and cool­
ing, brick veneer.

Don Parks, on the Rosston 
road has the inside painting 
under way. His home will 
have four bedrooms, two 
baths, double garage, heat and 
air, fireplace, brick veneer.

Houses recently finished and 
(Continued on Page 10)

Final Rites for 
Charles Reiter 
Held Saturday

Funeral services for Charles 
Reiter Sr., 77 were held at 11 
a.m. Saturday in Notre Dame 
Church of Kerrville with the 
Rev. Lawrence Walsh officiat­
ing, and burial was in Glen 
Rest Cemetery under direction 
of Plummer Funeral Chapel. 
He died the preceding Wed­
nesday in a Kerrville hospital 
after a short illness.

Mr. Reiter was born August 
20, 1896 in St. Vincent, Ark., 
and came to Muenster with 
his parents, the August Rei­
ters, at an early age. He at­
tended school and spent his 
early adult life here and has 
lived in Kerrville since 1931.

He was preceded in death 
by his first wife, the former 
Catherine Bemauer, in 1941 
and is survived by his present 
wife, Mary, whom he married 
in 1946.

He was a member of Notre 
Dame Church, ^veteran of 
World War I, district chair­
man of the Republican Party, 
a member of the Rotary Club 
and the Knights of Columbus, 
a former grand knight of the 
Muenster KC council. He was 
owner-operator o f Reiter’s 
Garage in Kerrville, a mem­
ber of state and national auto 
dealers associations.

Survivors are his wife; four 
sons, Dr. Charles Jr. and Al­
bert of San Antonio, Roderick 
of La Porte and Giles of Cen­
ter Point, 1 daughter, Mary 
Catherine Black of D e e r  
Park; four brothers, Clem, 
Wilfred and Alphons of Muen­
ster and Toney of Gainesville; 
four sisters, Mrs. Rosie Knauf 
of Muenster, Mines. Annie 
Otto and Catherine Luttmer 
of Gainesville and Mrs. Mild­
red Elmore of Denton; and 
nine grandchildren.

Among relatives attending 
the funeral were Mr. and Mrs. 
Wilfred Reiter and Pau l ,  
Lloyd and Sandy, Mr. and 
Mrs. Alfons Reiter; Mrs. Al­
bert Reiter and Monty, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Reiter, Mrs. 
Rosie Knauf, and A1 Walter 
of Muenster; Mr. and Mrs 
Toney Reiter, Joe Walter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Otto and Mrs. 
Catherine Luttmer of Gaines­
ville; Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hess 
of Lindsay; Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Kupper of Valley View', Mrs, 
Joyce Reid and Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Reiter of Dallas; Mrs. 
Jim Drozd of Austin; and 
Louis Knauf of Oklahoma 
City.

contacts were made up to 
then. Superintendent L. B. 
Bruns of Muenster High said 
that a number of applicants 
will be considered in a special 
meeting of the school board 
Friday.

Coach Steele leaves Sacred 
Heart with an outstanding re­
cord as head man of the Tiger 
football and track program. 
His gridders attained a record 
of 18-2-1 in the two years and 
his track team came home 
from meets with two top tro­
phies and four runner-up tro­
phies plus another trophy in 
a special event The basketball 
record was 15-32.

At Collinsville Steele will 
be athletic director and head 
coach of all the boys’ high 
school athletics. Collinsville is 
assigned to Class B competi­
tion in the Texas UIL, but is 
expected to be advanced soon 
to Class A.

Resignation of the two 
coaches leaves both schools 
with three faculty vacancies 
to be filled during the sum­
mer. In addition to the coach, 
Sacred Heart needs replace­
ments for the science teacher 
Elie Bou Kheir and the math 
teacher Jim Gehrig. The pub­
lic school needs replacements 
for Coach Richardson, the 
science teacher, Wayne Kle 
ment, and an elementary 
teacher, Mrs. Arlin Naegeli. 
Another vacancy was filled 
when Mrs. Irene Hartman 
signed as English teacher.

See San Antonio
While Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred 

Bindel were in San Antonio 
at the state convention of the 
Catholic State League they 
visited their daughter Cynthia 
and husband, Mr. and Mrs 
Malcolm Dennis and Sunday 
night were honored with a 
Father Day treat “on the 
town.” After dinner out they 
were joined by Lynda Kle­
ment, Janet Pels, Gayle Miller 
and Karen Schilling who al 
so attended the convention, 
and took a river boat ride, vis­
ited the Alamo and Breckin­
ridge Park, Incarnate Word 
College and other sights. On 
the way home they stopped 
in Austin to see the capital 
and St. Edward’s University,

our friends to come to the 
old Co-op office to see us. I 
know many will remember 
coming to this Muenster land­
mark to pay their electric 
bills.”

The Muenster office of Hes­
perian Savings will provide 
all of the association’s finan­
cial services including savings 
and loan services, drive-up 
window convenience as well 
as many special business and 
personal financial programs 
and services. Office hours will 
be 9 a.m. to 4 p.m. Monday 
through Thursday and 9 a.m. 
to 6 p.m. Friday.

“We are now making some 
special plans for all of our 
friends in the Muenster area”, 
Mrs. Hamer announced. “A 
sptecial free Community Dance, 
Saturday, July 13 th in the 
VFW hall will celebrate the 
opening of our Muenster of­
fice. We also want everyone 
to register before July 13th 
for our big S & H Green 
Stamp drawing. We’ll award 
84,000 free Green Stamps. The 
drawing will be during the 
intermission of the dance but 
winners need not be present.” 

Hesperian Savings, founded 
in 1890, is the oldest savings 
and loan institution in Texas. 
During the past 84 years, Hes­
perian has served many fam­
ilies and businesses in the 
Muenster area. The locating 
of a Hesperian office in Muen­
ster makes it more convenient 
for people in this immediate 
trade area to take advantage 
of the many financial services 
which Hesperian Savings is 
prepared to offer.

Summer in Switzerland
Sister Theresina, back in 

Muenster Thursday after be­
ing at the motherhouse in 
Jonesboro, Ark., for retreat, 
left Saturday from DFW Air­
port for Switzerland to sum­
mer with relatives in Zurich. 
Still living there are a bro­
ther and a sister*, an aunt, nep­
hews and nieces and former 
schoolmates. She will be head­
quartered in the parental 
home where she was bom. It 
is now occupied by fourth 
generation family members. 
Sister Mary John saw Sister 
Theresina off at 2 p.m. She 
arrived at Kennedy Airport 
at 6:05 p.m., left there at 7:30 
p.m. and arrived in Zurich 
Sunday at 8:15 a.m. to be 
greeted by a gathering of her 
kin. She plans to return Aug­
ust 5.

The Men 
In Service

Four young men from 
Muenster will complete their 
basic training in the Navy on 
July 2. They are Kevin 
Hacker, Tim Bindel, Eddie 
Knabe and Ludwig Kieninger. 
All are reported as doing 
great and looking forward to 
being back home on leave for 
the 4th of July.
WAC in Aviation

WAC Private Lenora J. 
Fleitman, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Edmund H. Fleitman, is 
assigned to the 3rd Infantry 
Division in Germany.

Pvt. Fleitman is an Air 
Traffic Controller with the 
Division’s Aviation Company 
in Kitzingen.

APPLICATION FOR
FREE RED CROSS SWIMMING LESSONS 
This form must be filled in and signed by 
a doctor and the pupil's parents.

Student’s name 

Address ............

Age_

I (Mr. or Mrs.) — ___ parent of
the above named, give my permission for my son or daughter 
to take the free swimming classes to be taught by the Cooke 
County Chapter, American Red Cross.

I (Mr. or Mrs.) would like
to take the free swimming lessons for adults. (Adults will be 
taught in separate classes.)

I, Dr. ----------------------------------- , physician, ceijfify that

----------------------------------- ------------------ is qualified to take the
swimming instructions so far as his physical condition is con­
cerned.

The applicant has the following handicap:

but is able to take the swimming lessons.
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Letters to the 
Editor

Dear Editor:
This letter is written as a 

reply to the June 7 letter 
about short dresses and long 
hair.

First of all, the dresses in 
this town are far better than 
in larger towns. There are 
some very short dresses but 
you seem to notice them more 
than I do and I’m a teenage 
boy. I personally have not 
seen any hinies. True some 
dresses are too short but 90% 
of them aren’t.

It also seems that women 
aren’t even supposed to wear 
dresses unless their legs are 
perfect (not too fat or skinny) 
Also this is summer time and
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ankle length dresses would be 
kinda hot.

Now about long hair on 
boys. First off nine out of ten 
long haired boys keep their 
hair clean. Some of the boys 
are letting their hair grow 
long during the summer break. 
And again who are we to 
judge people by the length of 
their hair. If they want it that 
way let them have it — its 
not your tangle. Some peoples 
hair is going to be gummy and 
sticky whether it is short or 
long and some peoples values 
are the same.

One last thing, this column 
should really be for sugges­
tions and not so much for un­
biased opinions.

Thank you — a reader

Barbara Davidson who is 
working this summer in Ar­
lington spent the weekend at 
home with her family, the 
Charles Davidsons, and helped 
her daddy celebrate Fathers 
Day. Barbie will be a student 
at A&M when the fall semes­
ter opens.
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I ist, and Butch Strawn, organ­
ist. Their numbers included 
One Hand, One Heart, and the 
Wedding Song.

The bride’s parents were 
hosts for the reception in the 
hall adjoining the chapel. The 
bride’s table held the three- 

; tier wedding cake which was 
baked by Mrs. Charlin Coch- 
ron, close friend of the bride’s 

i mother, and the crystal punch 
service. The groom’s table was 

I centered with a chocolate 
cake, held finger foods, and 
the silver coffee service, 

i Laura Murray presided at 
the punch bowl and Julie 

| Johnson and Karen Renfro 
served the wedding cake. Mrs. 
Peter Wall, sister of the 
groom, a n d  Mrs. Richard 
Schoech, a sister-in-law, served 
the groom’s cake.

Miss Karolyn Schoech, sis­
ter of the groom, presided at 
the bride’s book registering 
about 100 guests. These in­
cluded the bride’s 84-year-old 
grandmother Mrs. A. H. Murry 
of Dallas.

For traveling to Eureka 
Springs, Ark., and other points 
of interest in Arkansas and 
Missouri the bride wore a silk

Barbara Cullum 
Becomes Bride of 
Glenn I. Schoech

Since returning from their 
honeymoon Mr. an d  Mrs. 
Glenn I. Schoech are at home 
on SMU campus at 3515 Nor­
mandy in Dallas. They were 
married May 24. She is the 
former Miss Barbara Cullum, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Cullum of Dallas. The groom’s 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. An­
drew Schoech of Muenster.

Father Frowin Schoech of 
Subiaco, Ark., brother of the 
groom, celebrated the wedding 
Mass and performed the dou­
ble ring ceremony in the 
Chapel of the Cross Methodist 
Church in Dallas.

Presented by her father, the 
bride wore a gown of candle­
light organza with an overlay 
of lace fashioning the high- 
rise bodice with high neckline 
and short puffed sleeves. The 
full organza skirt was finished 
with a wide ruffle of tucked 
lace that swept back into a 
train. A Juliet cap of lace and 
ribbon held her bouffant fin­
ger-tip veil and she carried a 
nosegay of gardenias, lillies 
of the valley and baby’s 
breath. She wore a gold chain 
with an opal tear drop, a gift 
from the groom, and had a 
birth date penny in her shoe.

Mrs. Robert Zwick was her 
sister’s only attendant wear­
ing a pale green gown and 
carrying a nosegay of carna­
tions. Dale Felderhoff, cousin 
of the groom, of Muenster was 
best man. Robert Zwick and 
James Fincher were ushers 
and candle lighters.

Wedding music was pro­
vided by Patty Geddie, pian-

"It hurts here, Doc"
Ii can really hurt, on your 

vacation trip, if you lack 
proper insurance:

1. Trip Accident and Bag­
gage insurance.

2. L i a b i l i t y  Insurance 
(with high limits) to 
cover liability for in­
jury to others.

3. Camping, boat a n d  
sports equipment float­
ers.

Review your insurance 
with FMW Insurance Agen­
cy before you leave on your 
trip.

FM W
INSURANCE AGENCY
OLD LINE STOCK 

COMPANIES
MUCNSItt SUII IAN( HDO.

PH. 759 2257
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beige and red ensemble.
Both are seniors at East 

Texas State University where 
they will continue their edu­
cation when the fall term 
opens. He is a graduate of 
Sacred Heart and is majoring 
in drafting and construction. 
She was graduated from Car­
ter High School in Dallas and 
is majoring in elementary ed­
ucation.

The groom’s parents were 
hosts for the rehearsal party, 
a champagne dinner at the 
Ramada Inn in Dallas.

W. G. Jander, 84, early day 
Muenster resident, was back to 
spend a week seeing relatives 
and friends. He was with his 
niece Mrs. Charles Davidson 
who entertained one day, 
joined there by his sister Mrs. 
O. B. Siegmund of Gainesville. 
He headquartered a t A-OK 
Motel so he could take time 
visiting with old friends up and 
down Main Street catching up 
on news since his visit last 
year.

According to law, a mini­
mum of three persons can cre­
ate a riot.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Luke had 
as guests June 12 a nephew 
and niece Mr. and Mrs. Rich­
ard Olsen and infant son of 
Ardmore, Okla., and Mr. Ol­
sen’s mother Mrs. Louise Ol­
sen of Tulsa. Baby Andrew 
Darin Olsen was baptized that 
day by Father Eugene Luke 
in Sacred Heart Church. Miss 
Kathy and Jimmy Luke at­
tended as godparents. Others 
there were the parents, the Bill 
Lukes and daughters Nancy 
and Carolyn. They were all to­
gether for a christening dinner 
in the Bill Luke home.

Dankesreiter
Garage

General Auto Repair 
Air Conditioner Service

311 Division St. 
Phone 759-4521

Leo Henscheid

INSURANCE
Auto, Fire, Liability 

Ph. 759-2844

Muenster
Livestock
Auction

SALE EVERY THURSDAY

W e offer our 
service to assist you 
in buying or selling 

of live stock.

Bill & Sam Hamer
Phone 759-2201

84,000
Free Green 

9.S S S ta m p s
for every year Hesperian Savings has 
served this area.

Register at Hesperian’s Muenster Off ice now for FREE drawing!

20 winners will be picked July 13th.

1st Prize 
2nd Prize 
3rd Prize 
4th Prize 
5th Prize
6th Prize through 15th Prize 
16th Prize through 20th Prize

25,000 Green Stamps
15.000 Green
10.000 Green
5.000 Green
4.000 Green
2.000 Green
1.000 Green

Stamps
Stamps
Stamps
Stamps
Stamps
Stamps

84,000 FREE  G REEN  STAM PS -  TW ENTY W INNERS!

Ed Wright, President, Hesperian Savings,has announced the appointment 
of Doris Hamer as manager of Hesperian's Muenster office. “ We didn't 
have to look far for our manager. Doris and her family live right here in 
Muenster. Mrs. Hamer has been a member of our staff for the past seven 
years."

Doris Hamer, Manager, Hesperian Savings' Muenster office. "I hope to 
meet all of you during our opening celebration. Come in and have a cup of 
coffee with us. Be sure to register for our big drawing of free S&H Green 
Stamps." •
Hesperian Savings' Muenster office offers drive-in window service. Office 
hours will 9:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m, Monday through Thursday, and 9:00 
a.m. to 6:00 p.m. on Friday. Your savings at Hesperian Savings earn the 
highest interest the law allows . . i  even higher than banks, plus FR E E  
S&H Green Stamps.

Register before July 13th.

...for MORE tood reasons

HESPERIAN 
SAVINGS

Muenster Office, 501 E. Division (Hwy. 82 East), Muenster, 76252, phone: (817) 759-2283 
101 E. Broadway, Gainesville, 76240, phone: (817) 665-3485
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Mr. and Mrs. Albert Bauer 
Jr. and daughter Therese of 
LaFeria arrived last Thursday 
evening to attend the Friday 
celebration honoring her sister 
and husband, the Earl Walter- 
scheids on their 25th wedding 
anniversary. They also at­
tended the Saturday wedding 
of their niece Linda Voth and 
Mark Fuhrmann. When they

= THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE JUNE 21. 1974
returned home Tuesday their 
son John accompanied them. 
He had spent a two-week 
vacation with relatives. Karen 
Bauer, another daughter, had 
arrived Wednesday with the 
Walter Zimmerer family of 
LaFeria and is having a vaca­
tion visit with her cousin Con­
nie Walterscheid.

V

>

The Fabric Center

A L L  M A T E R I A L

20% off
J888SS8«8S88S88SS88S8S8SSg88ggS5

Quilt Scraps _ _ _ $1.50 a bag
ggSSSS®8SS8S88S8®58S®SSSSS38SSS5

for service on all Sewing Machines Call us 
Dorma Flusche, 759-4401, Muenster

Mass, Reception Mark 25th Wedding 
Anniversary of Earl Walterscheids

Flo Arendt and Earl Walter­
scheid who were married 25 
years ago on June 14 in Lind­
say celebrated their silver 
wedding anniversary Friday, 
June 14, in Muenster by at­
tending an anniversary Mass 
in Sacred Heart Church and 
following with a dinner and 
dance in the KC Hall.

Father Flacidus Eckart of­
ficiated at Mass and the 
couple’s honor attendants of 
1949 again were attendants. 
They are her sister Joanie, 
Mrs. Albert Bauer Jr. of La­
Feria and his brother Ervin R. 
Walterscheid of Muenster.

Anthony Luke was organist

COMPLETE
FUNERAL
SERVICE

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home

and Mrs. Leo Lawson of 
Gainesville, sister of the 25- 
year groom, was vocalist. Nep­
hews were altar boys.

Paul and Johnnie Arendt 
who ushered at their sister’s 
wedding were ushers again. 
The honor couple's six chil­
dren presented the offertory 
gifts. After Mass, the silver- 
weds’ only grandchild Jean- 
nene Walterscheid presented 
her grandmother with a long- 
stemmed red rose for the 
Blessed Virgin’s altar.

Mrs. Walterscheid wore a 
formal white summer knit* 
princess gown with silver trim 
at the hemline and silver ac­
cessories. Her orchid corsage 
was centered with a small 
silver “25” and her husband’s 
boutonniere also was centered 
with a miniature silver “25.”

Mrs. Bauer’s gown was de­
signed with a green bodice 
and flowered skirt.

Presiding at the guest book 
in the KC Hall were Mrs. Wal- 
terscheid’s nieces Mrs. Gene 
Nottingham of Houston and 
Mrs. Gerald Hess who were 
flower girls at the wedding 
in 1949. They registered 130 
guests at a table which held a 
picture of the couple and their 
attendants taken on their 
wedding day. A silver theme 
decorated the hall. Rohmer’s 
Restaurant catered dinner.

Mrs. Jerry Walterscheid cut

th e  three-tier anniversary 
cake and Mrs. Ray Voth, a 
sister, and Mrs. Donald En- 
dres, a cousin, who were 
bridesmaids at the wfedding 
25 years ago, served it.

A dance with Art Tofte’s 
Combo of Wichita Falls played 
for dancing to conclude festiv­
ities.

The couple’s children are 
Chris, Kenny who is married 
to the former Alice Klement, 
Ricky, Gary, Connie and Pat.

Since their wedding the 
Walterscheids have lived in 
Muenster all but about five 
years. He was working for an 
oil company that transferred 
him from Muenster to Mun- 
day to Wichita Falls and then 
back to Muenster. In recent 
years he is in business for 
himself as owner and manager 
of Muenster Electric.

Relatives and friends at­
tended the celebration from 
Idaho Falls, Idaho, Houston, 
LaFeria, San Antonio, Rich­
ardson, Nocona, Saint Jo, 
Lindsay, Gainesville, Denton, 
Carrollton, Commerce a n d  
Muenster. Mrs. C. M. Walter­
scheid, mother of the 25-year 
groom, was a special guest.

Cathy, Christy and Missy 
Glovqj- rode the bus from Dal­
las to spend a week’s vacation 
with their grandmother Mrs. 
Andy Hofbauer. Their parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Glover came 
for a weekend visit and took 
the girls back with them.

Wednesday Is 
Doable Stamp Day

You get twice the usual number ot 
Buccaneer Stamps on Wednesday with the 

purchase ot $5.00 or more in groceries. 
(Cigarettes not included.)

P*uu&uce.
Carrots - - - - -  2 bags 35c
Fresh Com . . 
Avocados _ -

. . .  6 ears 59c 
_ - - _ ea. 29c

r
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Save 60c
when you buy
2-lb. can of 

FOLGER'S COFFEE
Drip, Reg., Elect Perk

With coupon, 2-lb. $1.81
without coupon $2.41

Good thru June 22 at Fisher's

1

Family Size

T I D E

only $2.99
with this coupon 

without coupon $3.49

j Good at Fisher's thru Sat., June 22

Kraft qt.

Miracle Whip _ ____ 89c
Kraft 16-oz. Jet Puffed

Marshmallows _ . .. . .39c

Reg. 89c
e

Band Aids - - .59c
Reg. 95c Sine-Aid

Sinus Tablets _ _ . _ _ 69c
Reg. 69c J&J 65 count

Cotton Balls . . . .____ 45c
Reg. 98c J&J

Dental Floss ____ 65c

Swanson I 1.5-oz.

l

Chicken Dinner ____ 69c
Morton 8-oz., beef, chicken, turkey

Meat Pie _ 4-$1.00
Rhodes I-lb. loaf

Bread Dough . _ _ . 3 - 69c

M eati
Decker

Pressed Ham 
lb. 89c

Pork Chops
Center Cut

lb. 89c

Pork Chops
rib cut

lb. 69c

Neuhoff

Franks 
12-oz. 69c

Sirloin
Steak

lb. $1.49

Round Steak
lb. $1.39

Ground Beef 
lb. 69c

n e g g e s s s s s s s s s s s s s s a

GOOD BEEF
for your freezer

Home fed and 
Home Killed 

whole or half carcase

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of
1 18-oz. tumbler Bama Peach 

or Strawberry Preserves
Void after Saturday, June 22

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 16-oz. Kraft
Thousand Island Dressing

Void after Saturday, June 22

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 48-oz. size 
Crisco Oil

Void after Saturday, June 22

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 Jumbo roll Kleenex 
Designer Towels

Void after Saturday, June 22

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

Old El Paso 5-oz.
Taco Shells

Void after Saturday, June 22

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 28-oz. Lysol 
Deodorizing Cleaner
Void after Saturday, June 22

Phone 759-4211

FISHER'S
MARKET & GROCERY

Local News
B R I E F S

Lori Gayle Schmitz, infant 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Schmitz, was baptized 
Friday, June 14, 7 p.m. in Sac­
red Heart Church by Father 
Placidus Eckart. Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Schmitz attended as god­
parents for their first grand­
child. Others present were 
the baby’s parents, maternal 
grandmother Mrs. Anita Den­
ton and Luther Lowry of 
Whitesboro, Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Wright of Arlington, 
Mrs. Jo Ann Winters and 
daughters Dani and Danell of 
Dallas, Lisa Strait of Irving 
and Jim and Bob Schmitz. 
The christening party was 
supper out for a group of 13.

Five Muenster boys left 
Sunday to spend two weeks 
at the Young Marine Camp 
at Grand Prairie. They are 
Michael Sicking, Wayne Rich­
ards, Curtis Pagel, Jon and 
Michael Stephens.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Schmitz 
were in Sherman Sunday af­
ternoon at the funeral of her 
great-grandmother Mrs. S. A. 
Burk.

On VMI Honor Roll
David Bright Jr. was one of 

250 cadets named to the dean’s 
list at Virginia Military In­
stitute for the past semester. 
Requirements for the honor is 
an average of 3.0 or more on 

scale of 4.0, with no grade 
below 2.0. He is a sophomore 
majoring in mathematics, a 
son of Mr. and Mrs. David 
Bright Sr.

PAGE THREE
Mr. and Mrs. Lou Wolf had 

as weekend guests t h e i r  
daughter Charlotte and hus­
band, the Jim Barrons of 
Winder, Georgia, and their 
friends Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Tollinson, also of Winder who 
drove together and Mitchell 
Wolf who flew from Houston. 
They were together for a Fa­
ther Day celebration.

HAMRIC’S
Men's & Boys' W ear

*Jlt* Plac* la ya fa* 

P'uutcU ya**. Knout

Curlee, Jarman, Levi, 
Van Heusen. Wimbley, 

Melrose, Jockey, Campus 
Donmoor, Tom Sawyer

Sears Kenmore 
Zig-Zag

SEWING MACHINE

3 years old

Good Condition

Excellent for beginning 
Seamstress.

Call 665-0551 
Gainesville

Alter 5:30 p.m.

General Electric Refrigerator
with Top Freezer dispenses

c r u s h e d  ic e
OR CUBES

right into your glass!

20.6 cu. ft. No-Frost Refrigerator 
Only 30 34" wide

New Power-Saver Switch helps reduce operating cost
• Half-width adjustable 

shelves of tempered glass
• GE colors or white

• Huge 6.82 cu. ft. freezer 
helps save shopping trips

• On wheels

G. E. is America's No. 1 
Major Appliance Value.

TWO OTHER ICE DISPENSER REFRIGERATORS 
AVAILABLE-BOTH SIDE-BY-SIDE MODELS! 

Model TFF22R
21.6 cu. ft.— only 33" wide 

Model TFF24R
23.6 cu. ft.— 35% " wide 
(also dispenses chilled water)

GOOD SERVICE.. 
Another reason 
why GE is 
America's *1  
major
appliance value.

W E SERVICE 
)  WHAT  

W E SELL

Hess Furniture & Western Auto
Muenster
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Forestburg
News

FORESTBURG — T h e  
Headstart program got off to 
a start two weeks ago at our 
local school. It started June 3 
with 12 students. Mrs. Karen 
Westbrook of Gainesville is 
the teacher — her assistant is 
Mrs. Alice Shults.

Loyd Penrods as children and 
attended school at Forestburg.

Mrs. Mary Frances Blocker 
and daughter of College Park, 
Georgia, and Johnnie Sue Al­
exander of Jay ton were re­
cent visitors of the Woodrow 
and L. D. Sirmans. Mrs. Block­
er is a daughter of the Wood- 
row Sirmans.

Several of our local girls at­
tended the Junior Sew for 
Fun classes at the local school 
from June 3-7. Three of the 
ladies attending were Pamela 
and Veronica Edwards and 
Vatoni Dill.

Mr. and Mrs. Elvis Duck of 
Pampa spent the weekend of 
June 7-9 with Meb and Roxie 
Dunn. Mrs. Duck is the former 
Dorothy Brown. Dorothy and 
brother Leslie lived with the

Custom & 
Ready Made 
DRAPERIES

Expert Installation 
Available

Hess Furniture 
& Western Auto

Mr. and Mrs. Max Brogdon 
attended dinner in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Archie Peer 
of Alvord June 8. The dinner 
was to honor Mrs. Patsy Ho­
well who is retiring from the 
Alvord post office after 22 
years of service. Mrs. Ho­
well’s husband is a rural mail 
carrier. Might add that Archie 
Peer is the Alvord postmaster 
and is married to ,one of 
Merle Hudspeth’s sisters.

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Eld- 
ridge are home on a 30-day 
furlough visiting their par­
ents, Mrs. June Eldridge and 
Mr. and Mrs. Wassie Reynolds. 
Upon completion of his leave 
Larry will report to duty on 
the Island of Guam. Was told 
his wife will remain here for 
the time being. On June 11 
Mr. and Mrs. Eldridge and the 
Reynolds and their children 
took in Six Flags.

Putnams of New Harp have
been Mr. and Mrs. John 
Porch of Oklahoma City. The 
Putnams were in Bridgeport 
one day last week to visit with 
Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Mose­
ley and twins.

Mr. and Mrs. Herschel Holz- 
bog and family of New Harp 
and his sister Wanda of Den­
ton returned home June 12 af­
ter visiting .with his parents 
in Birdseye, Indiana.

Mr. and Mrs. Loyd Orrell at­
tended the Homecoming at 
Fleasent Ridge June 9. Pleas- 
ent Ridge is Bess’ ole stomp­
ing grounds. If you are won­
dering how Loyd ever found 
Bess over there in that brush 
— well, it seems the late Char­
lie Poynor tolled Loyd over in 
there years ago — Charlie 
was dating Bess’ sister at the 
time and got Loyd a date with 
Bess.

Mr. and Mrs. Jan McGee 
and daughter of Haltom City 
and the Gordon Hill family 
of Bowie were guests of Vera 
McGee June 12.

Mr. and Mrs. R. D. Weber 
and Mrs. Wynona Montgomery 
of Greenwood were guests of 
Mrs. Mae DeGraffenreid June 
8.

Recent visitors of the Paul

NOTICE
Due to Rising Costs of Supplies 

PRICES WILL INCREASE 
JUNE 24 AT

Angie’s Beauty Shop 
Carol’s Beauty Salon 

Crimp and Snip 
Evelyn’s Styleroom

Miss Leona Smith of Euless 
visited her sister Lenora 
Moore and spent Wednesday 
night with her.

Mrs. Linda Foster and chil­
dren of Fort Worth were Sun­
day guests of the Blake Free­
mans.

Visiting with Mae and Bill 
Landers have been Mrs. Lena 
Carroll of Dallas and Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Stallworth of Amar­
illo. The three Mmes. are sis­
ters.

Mr. and Mrs. Benny Barnett 
of Duncan, Okla., visited June 
12 with Mr. and Mrs. J. J. 
Reynolds and his brother, the 
B. L. Barnetts.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Williams 
of the Mallard Community 
motored to the Dewey area to 
visit with the Allen Taylors 
June 9.

Mr. and Mrs. S. T. Medley 
of Bowie visited with Jim 
and Nema Barnett June 9. 
Mrs. Medley is Jim’s sister.

Mrs. Helen Freeman and 
Darla of Alvord and the Gor­
don Stradleys of Decatur were 
Sunday guests of the Willard 
Freemans.

Karen Ellzey of Lake Char­
les, La., was a visitor of her 
grandmother, Mrs. Decie Ell­
zey, for the past two weeks 
Another granddaughter, Step­
hanie Fairbanks also of Lake 
Charles, arrived to v i s i t  
friends and relatives on June 
10. They returned home June 
14. Friday the Jerry Boetlers 
and daughters J u d y  and 
Phyllis, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry McGinnis of Arlington 
came for the weekend — also 
Mrs. Susie Nations and Shane 
of Roanoke were visitors. On 
June 15 another daughter of 
Decie’s, Mrs. Caronel Wright 
and daughter came from Tem­
ple for a couple of days.

Wassie and Rosemary Reyn­
olds were in Maybanks the 
nights of June 13, 14 and 15. 
Wassie was the announcer at 
the rodeo.

Myrtle McMillion’s cousin, 
E. R. Cagle, Jr., of Joliet, 111., 
visited with her June 14. He 
is a missionary and had been 
in Fort Worth attending the 
Southern Baptist Convention. 
He was on his way to Duncan, 
Okla., where his wife and 
children were visiting her 
parents. All the Cagles re­
turned June 16 to visit with 
the A. B. McMillions and 
Myrtle. The next a.m. they 
were off to Six Flags — then 
home by way of Duncan and 
a stop-over in Arkansas.

Other guests of Myrtle’s 
were Rachel Reynolds and 
Della Sigman of Bowie and 
Kenneth Reed of Sunset.

T 8c L Shoes 
Semi Annual Clearance

Shoe Sale
Save up to 75%

on women’s and children’s shoes
*

Gigantic store wide clearance. All shoes 
on racks and tables for easy selection and fast 

service.
All Sales Final No Lay-Aways, Please

Pay by Cash, Bank Americard or Master Charge

T & L Shoes
202 N. Dixon. 665-6081, Gainesville

iBANKAMERICAflDj

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Jackson j
attended the Installation Ser­
vices of the Greenwood Chap­
ter of the Order of the Eastern 
Star June 14. They were the 
outgoing worthy matron and 
patron.

Gary and Arlene Brewer of 
Wichita Falls and Terry 
Brewer of Weatherford, Okla., 
spent the weekend as visitors 
of their parents, the Elmo 
Brewers.

Mr. and Mrs. Truman Green­
wood and Denna and Rodney' 
of Pilot Point visited Truman’s 
parents the V. G. Greenwoods 
and other relatives June 14. 
Denna and Rodney remained 
with their grandparents for 
about 10 days.

Mr. and Mrs. Blakie Scott 
and son of Lewisville spent 
the weekend with her par­
ents, the A. B. McMillions.

Mrs. Mae Martin of Ard­
more visited her niece and 
family the Wylie Edwards 
June 13.

Guess the tomato season is 
here. Saw Dorothy Huddleston 
at home busy wiping, culling 
and packing them. Guess Jack 
Carter will have Janice, Jeff­
ery and Vesta busy too.

The mercy bench was very 
well occupied Friday. Lee 
Kuykendall, Robert Ensey, Ben 
Perryman, Tom Inglish and 
Mark Landers were the sitters. 
Audie Knox, Jim Landers, 
Bill Forrester and Herschel 
Knox were standing around 
eyeing the bench. First time 
I’ve spied Tom Inglish there.

Mrs. Dawna Vann of Mon­
tague entered a Dallas Hos­
pital June 16 to undergo fur­
ther surgery on her eye. Daw­
na was hit in the eye with 
a rusty nail thrown by a lawn 
mower. She had this second 
surgery June 17 and came 
through fine. If all goes well, 
she should be there five days.

Estelle Kelley, Prairie Point, 
attended the birthday dinner 
and party for her granddaugh­
ter Sunday. Miss Kelley has 
reached the age of one and 
resides in Gainesville with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lanny Kelley.

The Harold Prathers of 
Sunray started construction of 
their new home at Prairie 
Point. They purchased a one 
acre track of land from T. J. 
Amis. Mrs. Prather is the 
former Susie Sutton.

Some folks call this column 
Myrt’s ‘Who is who” column. 
However, they say they like it 
because they learn how folks 
are related and why certain 
folks visit each other, etc. Be­
ing a “foreigner” myself to 
this area, it helps me to know 
how folks are “hooked up” 
and better know them.

B I R T H S

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Fleit- 
man of Lindsay announce a 
son, seven pounds one ounce 
on arrival at Gainesville Hos­
pital Thursday, June 6, 1:05 
a.m. They have three other 
boys and one girl in the fam­
ily. Mr. and Mrs. William 
Fleitman of Lindsay are the 
paternal grandparents.

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Barrett 
of Gainesville are rejoicing 
over the birth of their first 
child, a daughter born Thurs­
day, June 6, 8:05 a.m. at 
Gainesville Memorial Hospital 
weighing seven pounds eleven 
ounces. Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Fleitman and 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Barrett 
of Gainesville. Great-grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. M. 
S. Thetford of Gainesville and 
Mrs. W. R. Barrett of Van 
Alstyne.

From 'Austin comes an­
nouncement of the birth of a 
son to Mr. and Mrs. Clifford 
Endres, first-time parents. The 
eight pound ten ounce lad ar­
rived Friday June 14, 10:53 
a.m. and is the first grandson 
for Mr. and Mrs. Paul Endres. 
The maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. V. E. Pruitt of 
Gadsden, Alabama. The baby’s 
father teaches at the Univers­
ity of Texas.

Junior Baseball
Grewing continues the lead 

in the minor league of the 
local baseball program, but it 
has no cinch for the trophy. 
In action of the past two 
weeks Wilde walloped the 
leaders and set themselves up 
as challengers. Records stand 
alt 5-1-0 for Grewing and 4-2-0 
for Wilde while Tuggle and 
Bank are out of the running 
with identical records of 1-4-1.

Scores in games of the past 
two weeks were Grewing 6, 
Tuggle 0; Bank 10, Wilde 3; 
Tuggle 16, Bank 15; Wilde 9, 
Grewing 1; Wilde 13, Tuggle 1; 
Grewing 13, Bank 1,

At Kin's Wedding
Mrs. Arnie Hess, Mr. and 

Mrs. Joe Horn and Mr. and 
Mrs. Leo Hoedebeck were in 
Kermit Saturday for the mar­
riage of their nephew Roger 
Yosten, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Yosten, to Cynthia 
Williams. Sunday the group 
drove to Big Bend National 
Park and stayed there over­
night. The next morning they 
drove to see the Rio Grande 
river. Enroute home Tuesday 
they stopped in Fort Worth to

visit Andy Yosten.

Mrs. Jerry Sicking spent the 
weekend in Decatur with her 
mother Mrs. C. M. Flusche 
and when she returned Mon­
day her mother accompanied 
her and went to Lindsay to 
visit relatives. Her brother 
Herman Neu of California is 
vacationing there.

Mrs. Doug Gantt of Idaho 
Falls, Idaho, was among those 
attending the silver wedding

anniversary celebration of her 
uncle and aunt, the Earl Wal- 
terscheids Friday and wedding 
of her sister Linda Voth and 
Mark Fuhrmann Saturday. 
She was the houseguest of her 
parents the Ray Voths.

Pat Davidson and Deryl 
Zimmerer of Community 4-H 
Club and Paul Reiter of Sac­
red Heart 4-H Club left Tues­
day morning for Trinidad to 
attend district leadership lab.

This chart will help you plan your savings goals. Put "money m agic" 
to work for your family, by combining: (1) Regular Savings — a fixed amount 
each month (2) The good earnings we pay on your savings (3) Earnings on the 
earnings you leave in, compounded at regular intervals.

How
Savings

Grow
$5

Monthly
$10

Monthly
$25

Monthly
$50

Monthly

1 Year 61.75 123.50 308.76 . 617.52

5 Years 343.88 687.75 1719.44 3438.87

10 Years 790.97 1581.94 3954.98 7909.96

! 15 Years 1372.26 2744.53 6861.54 13723.09

20 Years 2128.04 4256.08 10640.55 21281.09

These figures are projected at 5Va% a year, com­
pounded daily from the day of deposit until the date 
of withdrawal.

CERTIFICATES MINIMUM REQUIRED DEPOSIT
OF DEPOSIT ARE WHICH EARN HIGHEST INTEREST

AVAILABLE ALLOWED BY LAW.

Gainesville Branch of

G t
EQUAL HOUSING
LENDER

u w n g s
a n d J jp c v K

of Bowie, Texas

665-0316 and 665-0317 
316 N. Grand, Gainesville
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CLASSIFIED AD RATES 
First Insertion 6 cents per word. 

Minimum S1.00
Following Insertion 4 cents per 
word. Minimum 50 cents.

DISPLAY CLASSIFIED
First Insertion__ per col in. $1.50
Standing Ad -----  per col. in. $1.00

DISPLAY IN BORDER 
First insertion _  per col. In $1.75
Standing ad ------ per col In. $1.25

Card of Thanks $1.25 
LEGAL NOTICE RATES 

First Insertion 2 cents per word. 
Following Insertion 1 cent per word.

THANKS
Many thanks for cards, vis­

its, flowers and prayers while 
I was a patient at Methodist 
Hospital in Dallas. My family 
joins me in this expression of 
appreciation. — Mrs. Harry 
Scoggins.

To all who remembered me 
while I was a patient at Muen- 
ster Hospital, my thanks. The 
cards, prayers, visits a n d  
other thoughtful deeds are all 
appreciated, Special thanks to 
Dr. Antonetti, the nurses and 
hospital staff and the Rev. 
Fathers — Joe Lutkenhaus.

My thanks to all who were 
so good to me while I was a 
patient at Muenster Hospital. 
The prayers, visits, cards and 
other thoughtful deeds meant 
so much. Special thanks to Dr. 
Antonetti, the nurses, hospital 
staff and Rev. Fathers for 
their care and concern. My 
niece is grateful too. — An­
gela Laake.

Miscellaneous
CAR WASH on June 22, 

sponsored by Muenster Span­
ish Club, at Luke’s Fina ware­
house. Will wash, wipe and 
vacuum for $3. Come by, or 
call 759-4348 for pick-up 31-1

FREE Collie 
Pups. 759-4565

31-1

HORIZON MANOR 
Nursing Home Inc.

Type 3 Vendor Program 
Phone 825-3258
East Hwy. 82 

Nocona, Texas
25-tf

FOR SALE
FOR SALE: breeding ewes. 

J o e  J. Wimmer, 759-4449, 
Muenster. 31-1

SEVERAL GOOD used Re­
frigerators for sale. Hess Fur­
niture Si Western Auto. 31-tf

TANKS. Septic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks, water tanks. 
Will install. Bayer concrete. 
Phone 759-4244, Muenster.

Fire Extinguishers
for Home and Auto 

Community Lumber Co. 29-tf
Rabbits for Sale
Alive or Dressed

759-4297 29-4p
OKRA for sale also canning 

pickles by July 1st. First 
come first served. Mrs. Lawr­
ence Vogel,, 759-4468. 30-2

CERAMIC TILE New and 
old installation. For estimate 
call Ted Henscheid, 759-4280, 
Muenster. 5tf

MOTORS, all sizes, for milk­
ing machines, water pumps, 
oil field equipment, etc. 

NATIONAL BUILDING 
CENTERS

(formerly Shamburger)

Fishermen’s Inn Res­
taurant o v e r l o o k i n g  
Moss Lake, Crisper Cat­
fish, Seafood, chicken 
fried steaks. 11 a.m. to 
9:30 p.m.

Closed Monday
30-12

A U T O  INSURANCE foi 
young & old. 20% discount on 
qualified risks up to age 75. 
BUILDING FIRE POLICIES 
also 20% discount. Wilde In­
surance Co. 13-tf

Riding Mowers 
Self Propelled & 

Push Mowers
Community Lumber Co.

23-tf

Water Pumps
Submersible 

V4 H.P. to 40 H.P.

Plastic Pipe
A very inexpensive 

way to get water 
where you need it.

NATIONAL BUILDING 
CENTERS

(Formerly Shamburger) 
Muenster

26-tf

Cruise controls in­
stalled, for more comfort 
when driving, improved 
gas mileage. $79.50 in­
stalled.

Wilde Chevrolet
30-2

RED FOOT for tired, aching, 
perspiring feet, athlete’s foot. 
Kills odor. Red Foot foot pow­
der. Nick Miller’s Shoe Re­
pair Shop. 26-tf

NEW and Rebuilt Kirby 
Vacuum cleaners $89.50 up. 
Sales and Service on all makes 
of vacuums. Kirby Co., 835 E. 
Calif., 665-9812, Gainesville.

24-tf

For Home Delivery of 
Fort Worth Star Telegram 
or Dallas Morning News 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828, Bx. 546, Sanger 16tf

WRANGLERS
Shoes —  Boots

Work - Dress - Western

Nocona Boots
Men's & Boys' Store

J. R. Hocker
207 N. Commerce, Gainesville

FINE DIAMONDS 
WATCHES, JEWELRY 

WATCH REPAIR

KOESLER JEWELRY 
Muenster

JR. ELITE IS GROWING
»

W e need experienced operators, 
but will train those who qualify.

Employee Benefits Include
«

* Paid vacations
* Five paid holidays
* Paid hospitalization for employee
* Profit sharing program; no 

waiting period

We have a  liberal piece-rate sys­
tem which enables our employees 
to earn well over the $2 minimum.

Apply at our plant located at 
210 North Sycamore Street 

Muenster. Texas

BERNICE SICKING, Manager

Homelite chain saws. A size 
to fit your need. Community 
Lumber Co. 50-tf

PRE FINISHED 
P A N E L I N G

in stock at
Community Lumber Co.

See Jan Cain for 
MARY KAY 

products 
Free Facials

Call 759-2746

Sewing Machines 

Run like new  

Repaired at the 

SINGER CO.
835 E. California 

665-9812, Gainesville
17-tf

Good Car Buys
USED TRUCKS

’73 Chev. V6-ton, Loaded, 
Extra Clean.

’70 GMC %-ton, Auto.
’69 Ford V6-ton, 6-cyl., 

Auto, Low Mileage.
’69 Chev. %-ton, Loaded. 
’68 Chev. Vi-ton, Auto.
’64 Ford, 6-cyl., Std., Air 

Clean.
Several Driver Train­

ing cars available, Ca­
prices, Impalas, an d  
Nova.

W ilde Chevrolet

Fishing Tackle & Supplies
Muenster Garden Center

Call
Dan Luke 

759-2522
FOR

BUTANE 
PROPANE 
FINA GAS 
FINA OIL

Full Line
Arts & Crafts Supplies 

Artist's Materials

Decorated Cakes for 
all occasions

Carolyn's Craft Shop
759-2767, 9 a.m.-6 p.m. 

Carolya & Chas. Bayer 
N. Ash Street (43-t

CONCRETE WORK: Any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish 
ready mix concrete. Bayer 
Concrete. 28tf

_

ELECTRIC MOTOR
Sales & Repairs 
Oil field Wiring

Service Calls
Muenster Electric

8-tf

NEW & REBUILT

Kirby Vacuum  
Cleaners

SALES and SERVICE 
on all makes of 

sewing machines and 
vacuum cleaners
Rent a Kirby 

$2.00 for 24 hours

Hudgins
203 E. Calif., Gainesville 

665-2542, 665-5974
For service In Muenster 
call the Fabric Center 

759-4401

TORO LAWN 
MOWERS

Muenster Garden 
Center

24-tf

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies

Structural Steel 
and Pipe 

Metal Sales, Inc.
On Highway 82 

west of Gainesville

SAVE
On utility bills by adding 

blown in INSULATION.
See or call Tony Klement 

or National Building Centers 
759-2232 27-tf

REAL ESTATE
75 acres grassland 

Southwest of Muenster 
$650 per acre

E. M. Bass, 817-665-4860

HILL
REALTORS
817-668-7321
Gainesville

29-tf

Real Estate Broker
Bonded real estate broker 

qualified to act as agent for 
sales or rentals.
759-2257, Muenster State Bank 

Henry G. Weinzapfel 
759-4161, 630 Weinzapfel St. O

426 Acres North 
of Muenster, Rustic.

E. M. Bass, 817-665-4860

HILL
REALTORS
817-668-7321 
Gainesville

29-tf

LOST
LOST: Black & White Bor­

der Collie pup, 9 weeks old. 
Reward call 759-4184, 31-2

Strayed from Myra, Red 
white Face Heifer about 200 
lbs. Phone K. D. Snider, 736- 
2283, Myra. 31-lp

FOR RENT
Farm land for rent. 85 acres 

with 45 acres bottom land. B. 
C. Rosson, Myra. 31-1

FOR RENT: Small mobile 
Home, Central Heat & Air, 
furnished real nice. 759-2501 
or 759-2857. 31-tf

FOR RENT: Mobile Homes
for rent, furnished or unfur­
nished. Call 759-4437. 51-tf

MOBILE HOME for rent 2 
bedroom, fully furnished, a 
block from school on N. Wal­
nut. Ph. 759-2268, Jerome Pa- 
gel. • 16-tf

SERVICE
Boot and Shoe Repairs

The best in this part of the 
state. We specialize in correc­
tive footwear by prescription. 
John P. Cedillo, owner-mgr. 
MODERN SHOE SERVICE 

1323 N. Grand, Gainesville

BICYCLE HEADQUARTERS 
All sizes & shapes of Bikes. 

Must sell to make room for 
new shipment. Complete stock 
of tires & tubes. Firestone 
Store 108 N. Chestnut, Gaines­
ville. Phone 665-0776, ask for 
Jim. 21-tf

SHAG
100% Nylon 

Completely Installed

$7.50 sq. yd.
Specials on 
Roll Ends

Indoor-Outdoor
Carpet

Linoleum, 
Vinyl, Tile

Dale's
Carpet Shop
Dale & Pat Martin 

and Don Bezner 
665-2208, Gainesville

WANTED

Stereos, Tapes 
Records * 

Accessories
Every Day Low Prices 

8 track tapes, $2.99

Hudgins *
Don't Record Raok
203 E. California 

Gainesville, 665-9174

Applications being taken 
for relief LVN, aide and cook. 
And RN one day a week. 
Apply at Hillcrest Manor, West 
Hwy. 82, Muenster. 26-tf

Wanted to rent 
Pasture, call 759-2514

WANTED:
Rod Machine Operator
Must bo experienced 

Also helpers
No experience necessary 

Growing Brothers 26-ti
Buy, sell, rent with the 

Enterprise Want Ads.

HOUSE AND ACREAGE for 
sale: 15 acres improved land, 
3-bedroom house, excellent 
fences, stock pond, good wat­
er well, fruit orchard, 20x30 
ft. hay and stock bam, new 
workshop, 8 minutes north of 
Muenster. Owner must sell 
due to health reasons. See 
Henry Weinzapfel or phone 
759-2257 day time; 4161 even­
ings. 25-tf

FIRST TIME OFFERED
300 acres west of 
Muenster. 1 mile 
south of U.S. 82

E. M. Bass, 817-665-4860

HILL
REALTORS
817-668-7321
Gainesville

29-tf

Mr .and Mrs. Charles Ivers 
and children Donna, Theresa 
and Carl of Fort Worth were 
guests during the weekend of 
her parents the Jerome Pagels 
and joined in a Father Day 
observance Sunday w h e n  
Jake Pagel of Hillcrest Manor 
spent the day with the group.

Custom 
Hay Hauling

See or Call

W ayne Tate
759-4514

Dozer Service
Call or Sea

Frank Hess
759-4249

You Bend 'Em 
WE'LL 

MEND 'EM
Car rebuilding 

8c painting
Windshields. Door glass

FREE ESTIMATES

A L  H O R N
5th Si Cedar, 759-4471 

• 30 tf
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Westinghouse 
Appliances 

& Zenith TVs
Sales and Service

Radio <S TV Repair 
Muenster Butane

Ph. 759-4411

30-tf

W e Buy and Sell

G R A I N
and

H A Y
D & H TRUCKING CO.
Donnie & Herbert Fisher 

Phone 668-7056 
or 759-2751

WELDING
CUSTOM WELDING

See or cal] 
David Fisher. 759-4486

Custom 
Hay Hauling

Call or see
Garry Fetsch

759-2813

OUR CLEANING, pressing 
and shoe repair business is 
open Tuesday through Friday, 
closed Monday and Saturday. 
Nick and Adelina Miller.

GLASS: Plate, window, auto­
mobile, furniture tops, mirrors. 
Complete glass service. We 
h a n d l e  insurance claims. 
Gainesville Glass Shop. 665- 
3321, 311 N. Chestnut 37tf

ELECTRICAL 
INSTALLATIONS 

ft REPAIRS
Including Heating 

and Air Conditioning 
Residential Si Commercial

GRIGGS ELECTRIC
Day ph. 759-2232 

Nite ph. 768-2759
34-tf

oy Publ 
THE STATE OF TEXAS

TO: J. C. Humphreys GREET­
ING:

You are commanded to appear 
by filing a written answer to the 
plaintiff’s petition at or before 
10 o'clock A.M, of the first Mon­
day after the expiration of 42 days 
from the date of issuance of this 
Citation, the same being Monday 
the 29th day of July, A.D., 1974, 
at or before 10 o’clock A.M., before 
the Honorable 235th District Court 
of Cooke County, at the Court 
House in Gainesville, Texas.

Said plaintiff's petition was filed 
on the 14th day of June, 1974.

The file number of said suit 
being No. 74-179.

The names of the parties in said 
suit are:

Kenneth E. Hill and wife. Ester 
Louise Hill as Plaintiff, and J. C. 
Humphreys, et al as Defendant.

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to wit:

Suit to Trespass To Try Title.
If this Citation is not served 

within 90 days after the date of its 
issuance, it shall be returned un­
served.

Issued this the 14th day of June 
A. D., 1974.

Given under my hand and seal 
of said Court, at office In Gaines­
ville Texas, this the 14th day of 
June A. D„ 1974.
(SEAL) Anna Mae Shorter, Clerk 
Court Cooke County, Texas.

(31-32-33-34)

Muenster Milling Company

TJhe 3 e e d  P e o p le

Hours: Mon. thru Fri. 7:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Saturday 7:30 a.m. to noon

All orders should be placed 
one day in advance

Phone 759-2287

Shop and Save Dollars at
PAGEL'S STORE j

lVz-lb. loaf

Bread____ 3 -$ 1 .0 0

New item, 32-oz.
Dawn Liquid 89c
For Dish Washing

Carnation, 7Mi-oz.

Spreadables
85c

Chinet, 8 count

Platters
59c

Heinz 57, 10-oz.

Sweet Relish
35c

Nu Soft, 32-oz.

Fabric Softener 1 1 n

Mix or Match, 8 count
Hamburger Buns
Hot Dog Buns 3 - $1.00

Morton's

Glazed or Jellied 
Donuts

Like fresh from bakery

59c box
.......  .......... I    ll, ■ I . — -  M. .

Bar-B-Que

Sandwich ______ 39c

Lean & Meaty

Spare Ribs___lb. 49c
Bar S, all meat, 12-oz.

Franks________ 59c
No Rind

Slab Bacon___ lb. 69c
Bar S, sliced, all meat

Bologna____ lb. 79c
■

* %
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Molly Wimmer and 
Louis Gieb Are 
Married at Mass

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Gieb 
are at home in Lindsay since 
returning from their wedding 
trip. They were married in 
Sacred Heart Church Satur­
day, June 1. Mrs. Gieb is the 
former Miss Molly Wimmer.

Father Placidus Eckart cele­
brated the nuptial Mass and 
heard the vows in a double 
ring ceremony. Baskets of 
spring flowers decorated the 
altar space.

Daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Andrew Wimmer of Muen- 
ster, the bride is a graduate

Kent Bellah Studio 
Saint Jo

Open 10 a.m. to 5‘ p.m. 
Closed Sun., Mon., Tues.

II

In All 
The World
No one is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you.

GEO. J .

Carroll
SON

of Muenster High School and 
is attending Cooke County 
College as a nursing student. 
She is employed at Muenster 
Hospital.

Son of Mr. and Mrs. Bern­
ard Gieb of Lindsay, the 
groom graduated from Lind­
say High, served two years in 
the Army, is attending CCC, 
and is employed by L&M Oil 
Co.

Presented by her father for 
marriage, the bride wore a 
gown of white dacron polyes­
ter and Chantilly lace. The 
empire bodice was designed 
with a pinafore effect, sheer 
lace yoke, high lace neckline 
and sheer lace shepardess 
sleeves. A scalloped lace hem­
line ruffled flounce swept 
back into a semi-cathedral 
train. A Juliet cap of lace and 
pearls held her fingertip veil. 
She carried a colonial bouquet 
of white daisies, pink sweet­
heart roses, stephanotis and 
baby’s breath.

Adding sentiment, she wore 
the pearls her mother had 
worn on her wedding day 27 
years ago. And she had a 
birthdate penny in her shoe.

Miss Candie Wimmer was 
her sister’s maid of honor. 
Misses Patsy Arendt and Mon­
ica Gieb sister of the groom 
were bridesmaids.

Their gowns of crystaline 
organza over peau de soie in 
apple green, hot pink and lem­
on yellow respectively had 
empire bodices with pinafore 
effect and long sleeves. They 
wore picture' hats trimmed to 
match their dresses. Their 
flowers were colonial bou­
quets of white daisies, tinted

The Fram e m aker
Has moved to 107 N. Commerce

Creative Custom Framing 
Oils, Prints, Antiques & Gifts

107 N. Commerce Gainesville

THi TRUCK PCOPLI FROM OCNBUL MOTORS

New V2 & %-ton Pickups in Stock 
USED PICKUPS

Hoedebeck GMC
Muenster

DODGE, CHRYSLER, PLYMOUTH 
DODGE TRUCKS 

USED CARS&
Dodge

Plymoutfi
Sales & Service

UNIROYAL TIRES

TUGGLE MOTOR CO.
Muenster

Mrs. David Fisher 
Is Party Honoree

Mrs. David Fisher was the 
honoree at a layette shower 
Sunday, June 9, when a quin­
tet of hostesses entertained 
in the Paul Fisher home.

Scaring hostess duties were 
Mmes. Willie Fisher, Mike 
Kleiss, Donny Fisher, Jerry 
Hughes and Miss Lillian Fish­
er. They presented a baby 
swing as their hostess gift. 
The honoree displayed a show­
er of gifts from some 30 
guests.

Pickup foods, decorated cake 
squares and punch w e r e  
served.

Those present included the 
honoree’s mother Mrs. Vincent 
Felderhoff and her husband’s 
mother Mrs. Paul Fisher and 
grandmothers Mrs John Fel­
derhoff and Mrs. Frank Raus- 
chuber.

Champ Trapshooter
Randy Hay of Gainesville 

was winner of the Class D 
singles in the annual Texas 
State Trapshooting Tourna­
ment at Lewisville’s Single­
tree Gun Club last Sunday. 
He’s a son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Hay.

Back from Trip to 
Maryland, Indiana

Mrs.  Felix Becker, her 
daughter Mrs. Alphonse Hoe- 
nig and granddaughters Ann 
Sicking of Fort Worth and 
Sharon Sicking have had a 
week’s vacation in Silver 
Springs, Maryland, and Mmes. 
Becker and Hoenig had an­
other four days in Fort Wayne, 
Ind.

The four left from DFW 
Airport on June 4 and were 
guests of Mrs. Becker’s son and 
family, the Vincent Beckers. 
Together they went sight-see­
ing through the area, included 
the home ahd tomb of George 
Washington, and the national 
cemetery and military park at 
Gettysburg.

After one week the Misses 
Sicking flew home and Mmes. 
Becker and Hoenig flew to 
Fort Wayne where they were 
guests of the Andy Mudracks 
and George Hartmans.
Seeing them ’off when they 
left by air was Mrs. Wilfred 
Walterscheid a n d  meeting 
them on return was Alpjionse 
Hoenig.

In Fort Worth at Father Day Fete
Fathers Day was special this 

year for Norbert Klement and 
Mrs. Klement who had all 
their children and grandchil­
dren with them for a day of 
celebration at the home of a 
daughter and family, Dr. and 
Mrs. J. E. Marr, Jimmy and 
Pat, in Fort Worth.

Others there, taking food 
for a picnic in the yard, were 
Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred Klement, 
Chris, Mike, Jon and Greg of 
Mission Mr. and Mrs. Jim

Otto and Lisa of Garland, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dickie Cain and 
Tami, Troy, Scott and Shawna 
of Denton.

The Wilfred Klement fam­
ily came Friday and divided 
time with her parents, the 
Bernard Wolfs. Mike Klement 
stayed for a longer visit, 
spending this week with his 
Denton cousins and then to 
spend a few weeks with his 
maternal and paternal grand­
parents.

M & S
DAIRY & FARM CENTER
Purina Chows Yield King Seed 

De Laval Clay Perfection 
Butler Bins and Buildings

Farm Automation Specialist
1529 N. Dixon, Gainesville

Phone: Gainesville 668-7861 Muenster 759-2598

carnations and baby’s breath.
Joe (Skipper) Bezner was 

best man. Groomsmen were 
Steve Zimmerer and Terry 
Wimmer, brother of the bride. 
David Wimmer, another bro­
ther, and Gene Gieb, uncle of 
the groom, were ushers. Greg 
Gieb, a cousin, was acolyte.

Barbie andT3renda Wimmer, 
twin sisters of the bride, and 
Margie and Jeanette Gieb, 
sisters of the groom, presented 
the offertory gifts. David Wim­
mer, bride’s brother, was lec­
tor.

Anthony Luke, organist, ac­
companied Miss Bettye Dodds, 
vocalist. Her numbers in­
cluded Peace, Joy and Happi­
ness, A Time for Us; Our 
Father; and Let It Be. The 
latter when the bride pre­
sented a floral tribute at the 
Blessed Virgin’s altar.

On entering the church, the 
bride handed a pink rose to 
her mother and on leaving 
handed a duplicate to her hus­
band’s mother.

Wedding reception was held 
in Muenster KC Hall where 
Brenda and Barbie Wimmer 
registered guests at a lace- 
covered table that held the 
memory candle, bride’s por­
trait and a pink rose.

Guests helped themselves to 
finger food from a buffet 
table centered with a silver 
epergne holding pink car­
nations, daisy mums a n d  
greenery flanked by yellow 
tapers. Mrs. Jerry Walter­
scheid cut the wedding cake 
and Miss Gloria Stoffels and 
Mrs. Janell Escobedo, sister of 
the bride, served it. A dance 
followed.

Guests included the bride’s 
grandmother, Mrs. C. J. Wim­
mer and from a distance Robin 
Wimmer, the Byron Blacks, 
Chris Cagles, Paul Lukes and 
Barbara Pope, all of Dallas, 
Mrs. C. J. Heilman of Hurst, 
the Tom Berends and Sister 
Mary Heleft of Wichita Falls, 
the Ben Tubbs and Andy 
Arendts Jr. of Oklahoma City, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Eigenbrodt 
of Fon-du-lac, Wis. Others 
were from Denton, Saint Jo, 
Gainesville, Whitesboro, Call- 
isburg, Lindsay and Muenster.

MEDICA1L MART
HOSPITAL BREATHING

EQUIPMENT EQUIPMENT
WE RENT AND SELL

Hospital Beds & Rails Invalid Walkers
Commode Chairs Traction Equipment

Patient Lifts Canes - Crutches . •
Suction Pumps Breathing Machines

Health Safety Aids Air Mattress
. W e file all Medicare Claims

Grand at California 668-8661 Gainesville

Baker's, 12-oz.

Choc Chips _ _ _ _ _ _  69c
Reg. 39c bag

Tom’s Candy _ _ _ _ 3 - $1.00
Reg. 39c bag

Cookies _ _ _ _ _ _ 3-$1.00
Shurfine 16-oz.

Crackers _ _ _ _ _ _ _  39c
Shurfine 7-oz. box

Macaroni and Cheese_3 - 89c
Wolf No. 300 can

Tamales _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _  39c
Double Luck No. 303 can

Green Beans _ _ _ _ 5 -$1.00
Libby's No. 303 can

Com, c.s. or w. k . ____ 5-$1.00
Shurfine 10-oz. bag

Potato Chips _ _ _ _ _  .67c
Hunt's No. 300 can

Tomato Juice _ _ _ _ 5-$1.00
Food King 12-oz.

Catsup _ _ _ _ _ _ . 3 - 89c
Kraft 32-oz. jar

Miracle Whip _ _ _ _ _ 89c
Soflin 200 count

Facial Tissue _ _ _ _ _ _  39c
Shurfine

Hamburger Helper _ _ _ 49c
Shurfine 1.5-lb. loaf

Bread _ _ _ _ _  _ 3 - $1.00
8 pack carton

Dr. Pepper _ _ _ _ _ _  79c
Buttermilk _ _ _ _ Yz-gal. 69c

NEW ITEM, Reg. 67c, 2.7-oz. Peak

Toothpaste _ _ _ _ _ _  45c
Reg. 69c, J&J 65 count

Cotton Balls _ _ _ _ _ _  45c
Reg. 98c, 3.5-oz. Vaseline

Hair Tonic _ _
Reg. $1.83, 100 count

Bufferin _ _ .

_ _ 75c 

. - 99c

Double Stamps 
on Wednesday
With grocery purchase 

of $5.00 or more (no 
cigarettes) on W ednesday 
we give twice as many 

S&H Green Stamp*

MEATS
Pork Roast _ _ _ _ _  lb. 49c 
Pork Steak . _ _ _ _ lb. 63c 
Franks _ _ Neuhoff 12-oz., 55c
Silver Spur ,

Bacon _ _ _ _ _ _ _  lb. 69c

FROZEN
Donuts _ _ Morton 10-oz., 65c
Banquet 5-oz.

Cooking Bag _ _ _ .. _ 3 - 89c
Macaroni and Cheese or 
Spaghetti and Meat Balls

Swanson Dinner _ _ _ _ 45c

PRODUCE
Bananas _ _ _ 
Gr. Onions _ _ 
Yellow Onions _ 
Grapefruit _ _ 
Apples _ _ _ _
Cold

Watermelon _ _ 
Cantaloupe _ _ 
Cucumbers _ _ 
Potatoes _ _ _

____ lb. 10c
2 bunches 25c 
. . .  _lb. 10c
: _ 5-lb. 69c
____ lb. 19c

____ lb. 10c
_ _ _ lb. 12c
_ _ _ ea. 10c
_ 10-lb. $1.49

H O F B A U E R ’S
FOOD & LOCKER SERVICE

Phone 7594434

COURTESY

PRICE

SERVICE



THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE JUNE 21. 1974 PAGE SEVEN

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC

301 E. Broadway 
665-3521, Gainesville 

If no answer call 
665-2452

Henry Wadsworth Longfel­
low is the only American 
whose bust is in Westminster 
Abbey in England.

Alexander the Great was 
bom in Macedonia, , died in 
Babylon, and was buried in 
Egypt.

T G & Y
Enjoy the Jaycee Sponsored

CARNIVAL
and shop our 38th

ANNIVERSARY SALE
Store Hours 9 a.m. to 9 p.m.

200 North Denison Gainesville

Lindsay News
LINDSAY — Mr. and Mrs. 

Domin Kasparek and Doris 
had a short vacation spending 
four days with relatives in 
South Texas. In San Antonio 
they visited his mother Mrs. 
Frances Kasparek and other 
relatives. In Corpus Christi 
they joined a family reunion 
to help a brother celebrate his 
birthday. Clement Kasparek 
was the honoree.

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Noggler 
and Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Metzler spent two days in 
Galveston and Houston for a 
mini-vacation. They toured the 
space center, the Busch Gar­
dens, swam in the Gulf and 
visited other places of inter­
est.

Connie Hermes, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Hermes, 
performed in a dance recital 
at CCC women’s gym Satur­
day night.

THE WEARHOUSE OUTLET
(of Gainesville)

SUMMER SALE
Va off all Summer Ready-to-Weor

DRESSES —  JUMP SUITS —  LO N G  DRESSES 
HOT P A N T S —  ETC. 

in Junior, Junior Petite and Misse6 sizes

Fashions and fabrics from famous 
dress manufacturers

See Our New Fall Fashions 

TRUCK LOAD OF SAMPLES 

Don't forget our big assortment of fabrics

Store Hours 9 to 5 Mon. thru Sat. 
114 N. Commerce, Gainesville

A. 0. AND TEXAS 
FURNITURE STORE

Hwy. 82 W ., Gainesville, Look for the Big Red Bam

WE MUST QUIT — OUR HANDS ARE IN THE AIR

NOTICE: Due to several bad turns of events, we are 
forced to close out our store in Gainesville, Texas. All 
merchandise will be sold near cost, at cost, and below  
cost. Everything will be sold as is, no refunds, no ex­
changes. Please, no phone orders, no free delivery, so 
. . .  bring your trucks and trailers and be early!

CASH CHARGE or LAYAWAY

Glass Top
Breakfast Table
with 2 Director Chairs

Regular Price $188

Now Only $118.

Early American
Vanity Chest

Great for Kids
Regular $89

Now Only $39.

Collins Herculon 
Early American 

Queen Size
Sleeper

Regular $458
Now $298.

Spanish
Bedroom Suite

Complete
Regular Price $398

Now Only $258

Our Loss 
Your Gain 

Save - Save

Man Size

TV-Recliner
was $69

Now $36.

Naugahyde 
Man Size (Bassett)

Recliner
(1 only) 

Regular $198

Now $118.

Morse
Spanish Style Stereo

AM/FM Multiplex 
w /8 Track Tape Deck

was $428

Now $298.

Craftmaster 
King Size

Mattress & 
Box Springs

was $338
Now $199.

BAR STOOLS, wood with vinyl seats, only $14.

Going Out of Business Sole 
Sunday 1 'til 7 p .m .

and Mrs. Chris Darrington. 
First time grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Bezner all 
of Richardson. The other proud 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. Tim 
Gover of Los Angeles. Grand­
parents again are Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Corcoran of Cali­
fornia.

Mr. and Mrs. David Arendt, 
Jeff and Susan are settled in 
the home they bought from 
David Strittmatter. Occupying 
the house they vacated are 
Mr. and Mrs. Doug Secrest. 
She’s the former Judy Beyer.

i Macready and Den Dad Gene 
Pelzel accompanied the pack 
made up of Ronnie Fleitman, 
Mike Hermes, Stacy and Gary 
Hess, Doug Hermes, Scott 
Cooper, Michael Hermes, Matt 
Pelzel and Kevin Macready.

Installation of air condition­
ing equipment is moving 
ahead in Lindsay School and 
is expected to be completed 
by the time classes resume 
in the fall.

Father Bede Mitchel is help­
ing with pastoral duties a t 
Holy Name Parish in Fort 
Worth.

Mrs. Keith Park, Lindsay 
home economics teacher, was 
among 125 home ec teachers 
honored at a noon apprecia­
tion luncheon on June 11 at 
Austin College in Sherman.

The Nick Blocks had as 
overnight guests recently Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Slay and chil­
dren of Perry, Okla., who 
were enroute home after vaca­
tioning in Florida for a week.

Jerry Metzler, 1974 gradu­
ate of Lindsay High, has been 
named one of the winners of a 
$750 Clark Foundation schol­
arship. Son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Metzler, he plans to 
attend North Texas State Uni­
versity, majoring in broadcast 
journalism. Jerry won first 
place in the state University 
Interscholastic League per­
suasive speaking contest this 
year. His other UIL achieve­
ments also helped him win 
the scholarship.

Mrs. Joe Bezner Sr. has two 
new great-grandchildren, both 
girls. Proud parents are Mr.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Zimmer- 
er, Marie Zimmerer and Glen- 
na Heilman of Lindsay and 
th e  Frank Zimmerers of 
Muenster were among rela­
tives at the wedding of Miss 
Marian Betzen and Dan Har­
dy in St. Anthony’s Church in 
Hereford. Daughter of Mrs. 
Agnes Betzen and Robert Bet­
zen, the bride is the grand­
daughter of Mrs. H. J. Zim­
merer of Lindsay. The newly­
weds will reside in Tacoma, 
Wash., while he is in the 
Army.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hermes, 
Weldon and Charles, joined a 
family reunion Sunday even­
ing in Muenster honoring her 
father Tony Fleitman. Those 
attending presented Father 
Day gifts.

Mrs. Herbert Schmidlkofer 
underwent surgery Monday 
in Wilson N. Jones Hospital 
in Sherman.

Mrs. Richard Petrie is im­
proving but is still a shut-in 
at her home since being dis­
missed from Gainesville Hos­
pital where she was a medical 
patient.

Marine Cpl. David Stoffels 
reports being settled in Hawaii 
since his leave here with his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Stoffels and family. He pre­
viously was stationed at Camp 
Pendleton, Calif.

Activity for Lindsay Cub 
Scout Pack has included a 
field trip, hunting fossils on 
Elm Creek. Cubmaster Irby

Gasoline, Oil, 
Supplies 

For Your 
Farm Needs

Jimmy Lehnertz
Gulf Distributor 

665-4562. Gainesville

Or see local dealer 
Ferd's Gulf Station

Garden Club Meet 
Features Slides 
On Landscaping

A program of colored slides 
furnished by the Texas A  and 
M University Extension Ser­
vice highlighted the June 
meeting of the Muenster Gar­
den Club. Miss Sylvia Hof- 
bauer, assisted by Mrs. Roger 
Taylor showed the slides and 
gave the commentary on 
“Maximum Beauty and Util­
ity in Landscaping with Mini­
mum Maintenance.”

Nineteen members attended 
the meeting Monday night in 
the TPL Building and partici­
pated in plans for a new year­
book and program schedule 
with Sylvia Hofbauer in 
charge.

Mrs. John Mosman presided 
and led a discussion on plans 
for a pilgrimage in July and 
participating in. the July 4 
picnic. Mrs. Harold Flusche 
told of new requirements for 
the Sears Award and the EIP 
Award and discussed the pro­
posed mini-park for small 
children.

Mrs. Steve Moster gave the 
cemetery report and thanked 
volunteers who helped with 
the Cemetery Collection for 
Memorial Day. Mrs. Leonard 
Endres invited members to the 
Library Tuesday afternoon 
when the new portrait of Mrs. 
Joe Luke will be displayed for 
the first time.

Mrs. Arthur Endres dis­
cussed additional planting of 
shrubs and flowers at the 
Hospital and renovating of an 
already existing garden area.

Mrs. H. H. Houtchens gave 
the flower show report and 
Mrs. Paul Endres explained 
judges' criticism and com­
ments on the quality of ar­
rangements and cut speci­
mens

In a drawing for a ham 
donated by Hofbauer’s Mrs. 
Paul Endres was the winner.

Mrs. August Felderhoff was 
hostess for the meeting and 
served dessert to the members 
as they arrived. Mrs. Hilda 
Self was welcomed as a new 
member.

The June meeting closes 
the current garden club calen­
dar. The club will reconvene 
in September.

ANYW HERE

Treat the Family Right
Dinner here la a treat to the children 
and a rest for Mom. Enjoy the home 
cooked goodness of our food and our 
delightful atmosphere.

CLOSED EVERY TUESDAYROHMER'SRESTAURANT
Muenster

At Hereford Wedding
Among relatives and friends 

at the wedding of Miss Bar­
bara Brown and Phillip Ber- 
end June 8 in St. Anthony’s 
Church at Hereford were 
Messrs, and Mmes. Tony Wim- 
mer, Frank Zimmerer, John 
Fleitman and James Fleitman, 
Mrs. Felix Yosten, Miss Helen 
Hess and Charlie Wimmer of 
Muenster and Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Grewing of Lindsay. 
The bridegroom is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Berend.

Save Money! 
Save Tiine!

Prescription Is Our 
Middle Name.

Shop the 
Drive-in Window 

for all your prescriptions 
and drug needs.

W A T T S  
Prescription Shop

302 N. Grand, Gainesville

after you see 
your doctor,

• A*

bring your 
prescription to

MUENSTER
• P H A R M A C Y

- 1 PHONE 759 2833 |

Proffer Ford Tractor Co.

I ® !
Tractors
Equipment

SALES SERVICE 
PARTS

Firestone Tires

Lawn Boy Lawn Mowers
West Hwy. 82 Phone 665-0361 Gainesville

Large Assortment of Girls'

TOPS —  HALTERS —  HALTER SETS
Buy one, get one FREE

Girls' Pullover
Turtle Necks 

50c

Other
Girls' Tops _ $3.00

Long & Short Sleeve

Men’s Shirts

Jeans. 
Belts _ _ _ $1.00

Men's Shirts by 
"M adm an" & "Im pulse"

Buy one, get one 
FREE

[■ ■ ■ B  Open Mon. thru Sat., 9 to 6 
209 W. California. Gainesville

Pretty and Practical...
GLIDE-AND- 
FOLD DOORS

You and your family will anjoy these mart-looking,
smooth-working folding doors because they allow convenient, 
unrestricted access Into closets and pantries. They are ideal for 
use between rooms, too.

The unit includes four doors, hinged in pairs; an aluminum 
track; and hanger hardware. Made in four sizes to fit frames 
6-feet, 8-inches high, and S, 4, 6 and Meet wide. Choice of 
four handsome door designs including louvered, panel and slab. 

Visit or callus today for eomvlsts iu/ormation and prices.

Community Lumbei Co.
Jerome Pagel & Rody Klement

gS®S8 ®8 8 S8 8 ®S8 S® 8 8 8 S8 8 gSS®S8 8 S gS 8 $ 8 ®8®8 S8 S 8 0 ®
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It pays to advertise with the Muenster Enterprise

DR. JOHN GALEWALER, D.O.
AND ASSOCIATES

Announce the opening oi Gainesville offices for the 
practice of Family Medicine & Surgery. Evening hours 

on Monday, W ednesday and Friday.

306 N. Grand Ave. Hours 6:00 to 8:30 pan.
Watts Rx Shop Bldg. Telephone 665-0736

Jack Cheaney’s Saddle Shop
Dress & Work

STRAW HATS
H Bar C short sleeve

SHIRTS
WESTERN DRESS PANTS
« 8 S 8 S 8 g g S 8 8 8 8 8 S 8 8 S S 8 8 S S S 8 8 8 S 8 g S

BOOTS. BELTS, BILLFOLDS

211 W. Elm Gainesville

Carpet “ Party-Clean”  
Without Wetting

If March weather and muddy 
feet have soiled your carpet­
ing, it’s wise to give it some 
attention now. Wo recommend 
HOST, the new method of 
cleaning carpets without wet­
ting. Use carpet immediately 
after cleaning. Borrow our re­
markable HOST Electric Up- 
Brush. It’s easy. Clean walk- 
areas—only $5.95.

T IL E  •  L I N O L E U M

e m w

668-7411, 212 East California

m Q t m /
. MM. U  M>. O ff.

R EIN FO R C ED  F IL M
UNDER SLA BS EQUIPMENT COVER CRAWL SP A C E *

S ID E  W ALLS PLANT STARTERS CRIP COVERS

FENDER COVER M ATER IAL COVER CONCEALED FLASH ING

W h irtvtr you nood an extra-strong fabric to 
protact your work or materials . . . you'll
find V ISQUEEN ralnforcad ‘ ----------------
Idaal at an andosura, 
wrap, ground cloth

iread polyathylana film 
a. covar, lining, saalad 
or air-supported

g 1001 uaaa lar VISQUEEN Mm, 
VfaR or caS us today!

National Building Centers
Formerly Shamburger Lumber Co.

Phone 759-2232 Muenster, Texas

J. M. Weinzapfel 
Birthday Honoree

J. M. Weinzapfel was a sur­
prised honoree at a family 
gathering last Sunday in cele­
bration of his 80th birthday 
which was June 5.

Mr. and Mrs. David Bright 
welcomed the group to their 
home and grilled steaks on 
the patio to go with covered 
dishes brought by the rela­
tionship for the mid-after- 
noon dinner. In the evening 
a decorated birthday cake 
was served with coffee and 
soda drinks. Four generations 
were present.

Attending with Mr. and 
Mrs. Weinzapfel a n d  the 
Bright family were Msgr. 
Thomas Weinzapfel of Dallas, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Birden and 
sons Billy, Andy and Jon of 
Lewisville, Mr. and Mrs. H. 
L. Jackson, Terry, Jane ,  
Thomas and Toni Marie, Mrs. 
Jim Hoselton, Stephen and 
Michael, Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Cox and son and Mrs. Dan 
Estelle all of Fort Worth, the 
honoree’s sister Mrs. Tony 
Gremminger and her Sunday 
guest, daughter Mrs. Robert 
Mayer of Pilot Point.

Father Joseph Weinzapfel 
of Irving joined the party 
later in the evening.

Mr. and Mrs. P. W. Hell- 
man of Bristow, Okla., who 
had planned to attend had 
their plans changed after the 
tornado in Tulsa last Saturday 
night destroyed the home of 
their son Gus Heilman and 
family. They were helping 
them get re-located.

IT HAPPENED 
35 YEARS AG O

June 16, 1939
Refinery’s new tube still in­

creases capacity from 300 to 
1500 barrels daily a n d  be­
comes outstanding, industry 
for Muenster. Reception and 
banquet mark anniversary of 
local CDA court. New hospital 
will be built in Gainesville. 
Civic League considers join­
ing federation of garden clubs. 
Frank Hoedebeck is appointed 
city marshal. Montez Carter 
and Albert Steinberger marry. 
Muenster Boy Scouts get new 
uniforms. Work begins on im­
provement of rural telephone 
lines in Muenster.

30 YEARS AG O
June 16. 1944

John Yosten, 70, dies after 
brief illness. Knights of Colum­
bus reelect Arthur Endres 
grand knight. Season’s first 
wheat is brought in by Joe 
Trubenbach on June 9. Severe 
burns in tractor accident 
send Frank Hennigan to hos­
pital. Mary Ann Reiter begins 
work at Enterprise office. Mrs. 
Val Fuhrmann joins REA of­
fice personnel. Special services 
observe feast of Corpus Christi 
in Muenster and Lindsay.

25 YEARS AG O
June 17. 1949

J. G. Richards, 76, retired 
oil operator, dies in Warren, 
Pa. Garden Club elects Mrs. 
Nick Miller president. Coun­
ty trustees add Valley Creek 
to Muenster school district. 
Muenster gets 2.21 inches of 
rain; other areas get heavier

downpours. Community Coun­
cil reelects J. B. Element 
president. Sister Bertha is re­
covering f r o m  surgery in 
Jonesboro. Billy Whitt and 
Douglas Robison win first in 
range demonstration in state 
contest at A&M. Frank Haver- 
kamp and Walter Hermes are 
second in tractor maintenance. 
Earl Walterscheid and Florene 
Arendt marry. Mission Circle 
ships 192 rolls of hospital 
bandages.

20 YEARS AG O
June 18, 1954

State VFW names Mrs. Joe 
Lehnertz Mother of the Year. 
Sheriff Whisnand assigns Bill 
Morris to Muenster as deputy. 
Near half inch rain interrups 
harvest as work nears end. 
Gilbert Yosten and Jerry Fette 
get together in Korea for visit 
Marcella Hess and Julius Metz- 
ler marry. Ruth Fisher is hack 
in Muenster after teaching 
school in Tulare, Calif. New 
arrivals: a girl for the Johnny 
Arendts; boys for the John 
Ottos and Dick Grafs.

15 YEARS AG O
June 19, 1959

The first earthquake report­
ed in this community’s 70 year 
history shortly before 4:30 a.m. 
went almost unnoticed . . . 
only three people report feel­
ing tremor. Local farmers near 
end of harvest season. Local 
school taxes are raised to 
meet increasing costs. H u g h  
Endres and Lillian Morgan 
marry in Albuquerque, N. M. 
Reunion observes silver wed­
ding anniversary of the Ray 
Owens. Patsy Bayer, Suzanne 
Hesse and Patsy Vogel g e t  
nurses caps in Fort Worth. 
Muenster State Bank shows 
over half of county’s deposit 
increase during past year.

10 YEARS AG O
June 19, 1964

Mrs. John Walterscheid, 75, 
dies after long illness. Final 
rites are held at Myra for Tom 
Pryor, 88. Charlotte Wolf is 
chosen Miss Muenster, 1964 
and is crowned at JC pageant 
. . . will enter Miss Texas pag­
eant at Fort Worth. Work be­
gins on 24-block paving pro­
ject in city. End is near for 
one of Muenster’s poorer har­
vests. Father Harry Fisher 
gets assignment at Gainesville. 
Parish and city extend wel­
come for fourth annual home­
coming. Swim class has 193 
c h i l d r e n  enrolled. Sisters 
Marie Cecile Endres and Fran­
cesca Walterscheid leave to 
spend summer in Belgium. 
Francis Fisher and Eileen 
Ward marry in Houston. Bren­
da Tuggle is bride of Eddie 
Joe Reeves. Lindsay school 
continues f u l l y  accredited. 
Timely rain measures .60 inch. 
New arrivals: boys for the 
George Mollenkopfs and B. J. 
Embrys.

5 YEARS AGO
June 20, 1969

Funeral rites with military 
honors are held here for S.Sgt. 
Glenn Fleitman, community’s 
first Vietnam victim, at Shiloh 
Baptist Church; surviving are 
his wife and baby daughter, 
and his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Albert Fleitman. Bumper har­
vest is delayed by rain. Week’s 
measure is 2.11. Mrs. Rudy 
Heilman leaves on a tour of

FOE GATING OUT PLEASURE
=4)

Bring the Whole Family!
Dad, treat Mom and the Id dm to dinner out 
with plenty oi good food in our pleasant 
atmosphere with warm, friendly service.

W e Close Every W ednesday

The Center
A  Favorite Spot for Family Dining

the Orient. Mr and Mrs. Bill 
Becker are injured in car 
crash. Small twister hits 
Muenster but causes no per­
sonal injuries or damage to 
homes. Father Day reunions 
are held. Shirley Element 
and James Otto marry in Dal­
las. Linda Ford and Daniel 
Devers marry at Valley View. 
Poems by Mary Lou Kra- 
licke and Doris Schmitt take 
state wins in CDA contest. 
Blondie Fleitman postcards 
from Switzerland where she 
has a summer job. New ar­
rival: a boy for Mr. and Mrs. 
Gordon Lins.

A man whose normal weight 
.is 150 pounds would weigh 
about 50 pounds if all the wa­
ter in his system were dried 
up.

Lose Weight 
Safely

with Dex-A-Diet Tablets 
Only 98c at

W A T T S  B R O T H E R S
Gainesville

THE BAND BOX
A new shipment of

Lady Wrangler 
Vanity Fair Lingerie 

Junior Dresses

S A L E
Long Dresses Sports W ear

Dresses Pant Suits

«/4 to Vi off
109 S. Commerce Gainesville

How you'd love to see your dreams come true . . . 
dreams of a  better life for you and your family. Dream­
ing of owning your own home? Consult us for a  
Mortgage Loan. Dreaming of improving your present 
home? Consider a Home Improvement Loan from us.

Muenster State Bank
Serving the financial needs 

of this area since 1923.

“Where does my 
‘Electric Bill Dollar’go?”

When you pay your Texas Power & 
Light electric service bill, we hope 
you think of the many comforts, 
conveniences and pleasures 
electricity helps make possible.
But, we’re frequently asked—and 
maybe you’ve been 
wondering—‘Where does my ’electric 
bill dollar’ g o ? '
Let’s take a look at the 1973 dollar. 
Out o f every dollar received from 
every customer last year, 21<t was 
used to pay for the fuels needed to

generate electric power . . .  natural 
gas, coal and oil.
In 1973, the expenses o f running 
generating plants, keeping plants, 
lines, trucks and other facilities and 
equipment in good operating 
condition, paying the salaries o f 
employees, etc., required 20« of each 
"electric bill dollar”.
Another 20c o f each dollar was 
needed for federal, state and local 
taxes. In many of the cities and towns 
it serves, TP&L is the largest single 
taxpayer.
Funds to pay interest on the 
Company’s indebtedness and for 
dividends on preferred and common 
stock accounted for an additional 22t 
o f  the 1973 "electric bill dollar”.
The remaining 17c o f the dollar, 
representing funds set aside for 
depreciation costs and stockholder 
earnings not paid out in dividends, 
was used by the Company for 
construction of new generating 
plants, lines and other facilities.
Just as you must budget your income 
and make adjustments because of 
rising costs and changing conditions, 
so must Texas Power & Light. We’re 
tightening our belts . . .  looking for 
ways to produce and supply 
electricity more efficiently and more 
economically, while continuing to 
provide the dependable service you 
expect for your "electric bill dollar".

TEXAS POWER 8c LIGHT COMPANY
A tax-paying, investor-owned electric utility
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Karla Vogel is a new em­
ployee at Muenster State 
Bank. Daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Lawrence Vogel, she is a 
1974 graduate of Muenster
High School.

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTING

Fixtures
Supplles

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 
Installations, Repairs. 

Appliance Repairs.

Call 665-2721
Nights call 

665-3263 or 665-4456

Parker Electric
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hen- 
have had a week’s vacation in 
Pittsburg Kansas, with their 
son and wife the Charlie 
Herrs. T h e y  accompanied 
them home after their week­
end visit here and returned 
by bus. Together they went 
sight-seeing throughout the 
Pittsburg area and to points in 
Missouri and toured the Oz- 
arks.

Buy, sell, rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads.

Dorothy’s
Fashionettet

Beauty Salon
Open Tuesday 
thru Saturday
VICKIE KUHN 

DOROTHY MITCHELL 
PEGGY WATTS

665 - 9402
303 S. Chestnut 

Gainesville
Beauty is not a Gift, 

It's a Habit."

S U M M E R  S P E C I A L
16x20 Living Color

OUTDOOR PORTRAIT
Regular
$60.00
Value *39.95

Call for appointment

GENE'S PHOTOS
106 W. Elm 665-4742

Gainesville

THE HOBBY HOUSE

Super Tiger 15 Engines $29.98
H. O. Locomotives $5.98 & $6.98 
Decoupage Prints 25 to 50% off

10% offCraft Kits 
Needlepoint Kits 
Stitchery Kits

Sale ends Saturday, June 22

205 E. California Gainesville

Carla Schilling 
Allen Truebenbach 
Say Vows at Mass

Miss Carla Schilling and Al­
len Truebenbach who were 
married June 8 and who hon­
eymooned in San Antonio are 
back in Muenster to make 
their home.

Their nuptial Mass was cele­
brated in Sacred H e a r t  
Church, 5 p.m. by Father Step­
hen Eckart who also heard the 
vows in a double ring cere­
mony.

Parents of the couple are 
Carl Schilling and the late 
Mrs. Schilling and Mr. and 
Mrs. Andy Truebenbach.

Presented by her father, 
the bride wore a gown of ny-

Cilalion Bv Publication
THE STA^E OF TEXAS 

TO: Rose Easter Cunningham 
GREETING:

You are commanded to appear
by filing a written answer to the 

petit!
10 o ’clock A. M. of the first Mon-
plaintiffs petition at or before
day after the expiration of 42 days 
from the date of issuance of this 
Citation the same being Monday 
the 15th day of July. A. D., 1974, 
at or before 10 o’clock A. M., be­
fore the Honorable 16th District 
Court of Cooke County, at the 
Court House in Gainesville, Texas.

Said plaintiffs petition was filed 
on the 16th day of May, 1974.

The file number of said suit be­
ing No. 74-149.

The names of the parties in 
said suit are:

John Edward Cunningham as 
Plaintiff, and Rose Easter Cunning­
ham as Defendant.

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows to wit: 
Suit for Divorce.

If this Citation is not served 
within 90 days after the date of its 
issuance, it shall be returned un­
served.

Issued this the 31st day of May 
A. D., 1974.

Given under my hand and seal 
of said Court at office in Gaines­
ville. Texas, this the 31st day of 
May A. D„ 1974.
(SEAL) Anna Mae Shorter, Clerk 
Court Cooke County, Texas.

(29-30-31-32)

Ion organza and lace, the em­
pire bodice featuring a ruffled 
pinafore effect, high neckline 
and deep cuffed b i s h o p  
sleeves. The skirt was finished 
with lace motifs and a sheer 
ruffle and swept back into a 
semi-cathedral train. A lace 
headpiece held her elbow- 
length veil and her flowers 
were a colonial bouquet of 
white daisies, wheat, yurro

and baby’s breath. She bor­
rowed a gold cross and chain 
from her aunt and godmother 
Mrs. Ed Endres and had a 
birthdate penny in her shoe.

Miss Ann Bartush was maid 
of honor. A cousin Mrs. Brian 
Bezner of Denton was bride’s 
matron. Miss Janet Swirczyn- 
ski and Miss Karen Schilling, 
sister of the bride, were brides­
maids.

They wore white floral ny­
lon organza gowns, Misses 
Bartush a n d  Swirczynski’s 
over yellow taffeta, the other 
two over green taffeta. De­
signed with empire bodices, 
puffed sleeves and ruffled 
necklines, the gowns ended 
with a ruffled hemline flounce. 
They wore white picture hats 
with taffeta trim to match 
their dresses, and carried clus­
ters of gold daisies and baby’s 
breath.

Groom’s attendants were his 
brother Andy Truebenbach 
Jr., best marf; Melvin Schill­
ing, brother of the bride. Gene 
Voth and Herbie Fette Jr., 
groomsmen.

Mass servers were Dale 
Schilling, brother of the bride, 
Bert Miller, Monte Endres 
and Kirk Mollenkopf, her 
cousin, and Giles Truebenbach, 
nephew of the groom.

Miss Mary Lou Kralicke 
was organist and joined Mrs. 
Chris Cagle and Miss Yvonne 
Gehrig in vocal numbers. 
These included Wedding Song, 
Let It Be Me, Into Your Hands, 
and Peace, Joy and Happiness.

The bride’s grandmother 
Mrs. Albert Henscheid handed 
her a floral tribute of carna­
tions to place on the Blessed 
Virgin’s altar after Mass.

Wedding reception for about 
200 relatives and friends was 
held in the VFW Hall where 
Mrs. Sam Bezner of Gaines­
ville and Miss Cheryl Mollen­
kopf registered guests.

For their wedding trip the 
bride wore a three-piece 
pink and white checked en­
semble. She is a graduate of 
Sacred Heart High School

Citation by Publication
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: Daniel Blodgett, GREET­
ING:

You are commanded to appear 
by filing a written answer to the 
plaintiff's petition at or before 10 
o'clock A. M. of the first Monday 
after the expiraUon of 42 days 
from the date o? issuance of this 
Citation the same being Monday 
the 15th day of July. A. D., 1974, 
at or before 10 o ’clock A. M., be­
fore the Honorable W. C. Boyd 
Court of Cooke County, at the 
Court House in Gainesville, Texas.

Said plaintiff’s petition was filed 
on the 3td day of June, 1974.

The file number of said suit be­
ing No. 74-163.

The names of the parUes in said
suit are:

Loretta F. Blodgett as Plaintiff, 
and Daniel Blodgett as Defendant.

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to wit: 
Suit for Divorce.

If this Citation is not served 
within 90 days after the date of 
its issuance, it shall be returned 
unserved.

Issued this the 3rd day of June 
A. D., 1974.

Given under my hand and seal 
of said Court, at office in Gaines­
ville, Texas, this the 3rd day of 
June A. D., 1974.
(SEAL) Anna Mae Shorter, Clerk 
Court Cooke County, Texas.
By Kay Case, Deputy 29-30-31-32

and is employed at Jr. Elite. 
The groom, also a graduate 
of Sacred Heart High, is em­
ployed at Twin Pine Farms.

The rehearsal dinner hosted 
by the groom’s parents was 
held at The Center for 25 
guests.

Pre-Nuptial Parties
Pre-nuptial courtesies in­

cluded a miscellaneous shower 
in TP&L community room 
with Miss Janet Swirczynski 
and Mrs. John Monday as hos­
tesses, a rice bag party given 
by Mrs. Sam Bezner in her 
home at ’ Gainesville, an in­
formal surprise party with a 
cookout in City Park hosted 
by Misses, Cheryl Mollenkopf 
and Pam Walterscheid, and a 
luncheon given by Mrs. Brian 
Bezner of Denton in the home 
of Mrs. Albert Henscheid.

THEY ARE HERE
F-250 SUPER CAB

Supercab by Ford
The pickup cab roomy enough for a back seat.

Works like a truck. Rides like a  car.

Endres Motor CompanyFORD
TRUCKS

MUENSTER. TEXAS

4-Hers Perform in 
Annual Horse Show

Jingling spurs and squeak­
ing leather were the dominant 
sounds this past Tuesday as 
4-Hers from throughout Cooke 
County participated in the an­
nual 4-H Horse Show. The 
4-Hers were competing for 
the right to represent Cooke 
County at the District 4-H 
Show to be held Saturday, 
July 6 at the Cutter Bill Live­
stock Arena in Denton.

The 4-Hers were competing 
in two major divisions includ­
ing Halter and Performance. 
Performance classes were di­
vided into Junior and Senior 
Divisions, while all age groups 
showed in the Halter Classes. 
Trophies were presented to 
the first place winner in each 
division as well as the High 
Junior High Senior and High 
Individual Overall.

Janet Sicking of Muenster 
was the High Senior contest­
ant and High Individual over­
all. Taking top honors in the 
Junior Division was P h i l  
Graves of Pilot Point. Shorty 
Parks of the Running G Ranch 
in Plano was the judge for 
the event and C. J. Shellen- 
berger of Gainesville served 
as Ring steward. Announcer 
for the event was Darnell 
Graves of Pilot Point.

The top ten individuals and 
those representing C o o k e  
County at the District Horse 
Show include Janet Sicking, 
Mary Lou Fleitman and Karla 
Sicking of Muenster.

Muenster entries and their 
wins are as follows:

Halter, geldings, three years 
or older — Mary Lou Fleit­
man, first; Janet Sicking, 
third; Larry Fleitman, fourth.

Mares, three years or older— 
Karla Sicking, third; Char­
lotte Fleitman, fourth; Nancy 
Sicking, sixth.

Showmanship — Mary Lou 
Fleitman, first; Janet Sicking, 
sixth.

Performance, Senior Wes­
tern Pleasure — Janet Sick­
ing, fourth; Mary Lou Fleit­
man, sixth.

Junior, Reining — Nancy 
Sicking, first; Larry Fleitman, 
t h i r d ;  Charlotte Fleitman, 
sixth.

Senior Reining — Janet 
Sicking, fourth.

Junior Barrells — Karla 
Sicking, second; Charlotte 
Fleitman, third.

Senior Barrells — Janet 
Sicking, first.

Junior Poles — Karla Sick­
ing. second; Larry Fleitman, 
fifth, Nancv Sicking, sixth.

Senior Poles — Janet Sick­
ing, first.

Mrs. Oscar Detten had as 
guests one day last week her 
daughter Mrs. Bill Farrer and 
children Steve and Michelle 
and friends Mr. and Mrs. Ron­
nie Moran, all of Fort Worth. 
Steve stayed several days with 
his grandmother until his par­
ents and sister came for him.

Diane Sicking Is 
Honoree at Coffee

Miss Dianne Sicking, bride- 
elect of Keith Clegg, was 
honored with a coffee Satur­
day, June 8, in Gainesville, 
irt the home of Mrs. Kenneth 
Rippey.

Co-hostesses were Mmes. J.
A. Enderby, A. L. Burris, Joe
B. Townsley and Joe A. Wil­
son.

Registering guests was Miss 
Darlene Hess. The small table 
held a bud vase of white 
daisies.

The refreshment table was 
covered with a n imported 
handmade white pineapple 
linen, and lace tablecloth. A 
flower arrangement in shades 
of pink, in a crystal and silver 
epergne, centered the table. 
Coffee and pick-up foods were 
served from . silver appoint­
ments. Miss Nelda Schon of 
Pilot Point served coffee.

Receiving guests with the 
honoree were mothers of the 
betrothed c o u p l e ,  Mmes. 
Woodrow Clegg and Wilfred 
Sicking, Mrs. Bill Graham, 
the bride-elect’s aunt, and 
Mrs. Rippey;

Special guests were a grand­
mother, Mrs. George Burrow 
of Whitesboro and an aunt, 
Mrs. George C. Burrow.

Miss Sicking and Clegg will 
be married July 20 in Sacred 
Heart Church.

Miss Anita Marie Stephens 
flew to Anchorage, Alaska, 
last Tuesday to spend two 
or three weeks with her pa­
ternal grandparents.

Mr. and Mrs. Stan Wylie 
and sons William and Johnny 
spent Thursday and Friday 
here with her mother Mrs. 
Bill Kathman.

COOKS IN 
M IN U T E SMICROWAVE OVEN

fro m  S h a rp

R6300

• Large capacity. Fully 
graduated timer. Flash 
defrost.. .  frozen foods 
defrost quickly.

• Can easily be moved 
outdoors for summer 
cooking... plugs into any 
AC socket.

•Easy to operate.

Only $336.21
Rollabout cart available

' F i r e s t o n e
108 N. Chestnut. 665-4189 

Gainesville

DEEP STEAM CARPET CLEANING 

CUSTOM PICTURE FRAMING

C ec il N ew la n d
2005 E. Hwy. 82 Gainesville 665-2461

SPECIAL
at the Dairy Inn

Tues., Wed., Thurs., June 25-26-27
Reg. 35c

Com Dog _ _ _ _ _ _ _  29c
Reg. 30c

Large Drink _ _ _ _ _ _  24c

W e now have

Chocolate Ice Cream

W E N O W  HAVE

Tony’s Pizza
Sausage Pepperoni
Cheese Hamburger

Canadian Bacon

The D airy Inn

Model AHLR418BA

"Hrrt
ROOM AIR 

CONDITIONER
ONLY

*279
• 18,000 BTU/H cooling.

230 volts. •

• Antique White Simulated 
Walnut Finish with Brass 
Handle, concealed controls.

• Quiet three-speed operation 
withfour-way air direotlon 
•nd 8-posttlon thermostat.

• Washable fllp-out filter.
• Perfect for window or 

tnru-the-wall Installation.

O tts  F u rn itu re
104 W. Main Gainesville
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Lens-View
A new idea for raising 

money — build a grand stand 
in front of our dance halls, 
have a teen dance every Sat­
urday night and sell tickets to 
spectators to watch the fight. 
People who think Muenster 
is a sleepy town should have 
been here last Saturday night. 
The seven police cars added 
to the excitement and as usual 
the law won. It did make a 
busy night for the Gainesville 
hospital where the visiting 
team received treatment.

*  •  *

The U. S. Consumer Pro­
ducts Safety Commission de­
cided not to ban fireworks 
until after July 4th. They state 
the manufacturers and traders 
would have lost too much 
money because of their inven­
tories, had the ban gone into 
effect before the 4th.

Burns, eye injury and fires 
were the reasons given to ban 
the fireworks but now its OK 
to get injured or start a fire 
through the 4th. Those same 
people make us fasten seat 
belts before we can start our 
cars.

• • •

In a hotel in Japan there is 
a solid gold bathtub which 
weighs 313 pounds and at to­
days price of gold is worth 
$827,640. It’s not for sale be­
cause it’s rented out at $2.00 
per minute — bathing in it is 
believed to prolong life.

• • •
Why can’t life’s problems 

hit us when we’re 18, and we 
know everything.

Sign on a YMCA “Streak­
ers Repent — your end is in 
sight.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Crow and 
children Bill and Beverly of 
Archer City spent Fathers 
Day with her father Bill 
Derichsweiler.

,DINE O U T  4

Caras Curtwood

Breakfast - Lunch - Dinner

FINEST FOOD 
CURTEOUS SERVICE

Serve yourself at our
SALAD-RELISH BAR

Gainesville

Senior Baseball
With only three more games 

to go, the Center holds a 
slim lead in the senior league 
of the local baseball loop. Af­
ter winning the first four, it 
was dumped by Muenster 
Mill and tied by Endres.

The result is that Mill steps 
forward as a contender for 
the title. It now has a record 
of 4-2-0 whereas Center has 
4-1-1. Co-op is in third spot 
with 3-3-0 and luckless En­
dres after breaking the los­
ing streak still doesn’t have a 
win, and its record is 0-5-1.

In games of the past two 
weeks the scores were Center 
9, Co-op 2; Mill 9, Endres 1; 
Co-op 4, Endres 1; Mill 7, Cen­
ter 5; Mill 8, Co-op 2; Cen­
ter 7, Endres 7.

C of C Considers 
Brochure of City

Members of the Muenster 
Chamber of Commerce at their 
r e g u l a r  luncheon meeting 
Tuesday considered the pub­
lication of a brochure for the 
promotion of this town.

They heard the representa­
tive of a printing firm des­
cribe styles and sizes of bro­
chures in single or multi-color, 
and the prices relative to 
each.

Outcome of the meeting 
was the appointment of a 
committee headed by Henry 
Weinzapfel 'to study all de­
tails relative to the proposal, 
particularly ways and means 
to “finance it.

The brochure is regarded as 
the best way to present a con­
cise and interesting story of 
Muenster to anyone who may 
be concerned.

Party June 25 to 
End Story Hour

Story H o u r  at Muenster 
Public Library will be held 
for the last time this sum­
mer next Tuesday, June 25, 
and will end with a party.

The first half hour will be 
devoted to story telling as us­
ual and the next half hour 
will feature a party with 
treats.

All children who partici­
pated during the six-week 
sessions are invited to be 
there next Tuesday.

It pays to advertise with 
the Muenster Enterprise.

DANCE
Friday, June 21

8 to 12

Cherry Rhone
At

The Cove
Lindsay

I Hillcrest Manor | 
News |

Whaley Memorial Metho­
dist Church of Gainesville is 
in charge of Sunday afternoon 
services at the Home during 
June and the associate pastor 
Rev. Charles Cryan gave the 
devotional the past Sunday. 
Mrs. Edna Orrell of Nocona 
who was visiting her sister 
staffer Tommy Hogan, played 
the piano for singing which 
Mrs. Hogan led.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Ford of 
New Deal visited their cousin 
CLARA FORD Saturday. They 
missed JIM FORD who had 
not been released from Gaines­
ville Hospital where he had 
foot surgery.

JAKE PAGEL spent • Sun­
day with.his son and family, 
the Jerome Pagels celebrating 
Father’s Day. Early Father 
Day visitors were his daugh­
ters Mrs. Jack Janicki and 
Mrs. Hal Falck of San An­
tonio who‘ visited him Thurs­
day and Friday.

Mrs. Katie Wilder visited 
Sunday with her sister Mrs. 
JENNY SCHILLING and had 
dinner with her. Mrs. Wilder, 
80, who plays the harmonica 
entertained w i t h  old-time 
tunes.

Former staffers Mr. and Mrs. 
Hollis Kidd of Saint Jo were 
back as visitors Sunday going 
from room to room visiting 
residents.

ANGELA LAAKE was wel­
comed back Friday afternoon 
on dismissal from Muenster 
Hospital where she was a 
medical patient ten days.

Mrs. C o r a  Mitchell of 
Gainesville was a Sunday vis­
itor with Mrs. SUSIE BER- 
NAUER.

JENNY SCHILLING spent 
Friday with her daughter Mrs. 
Alfons Walterscheid having 
dinner and supper with her. 
Mrs. Schilling observed her 
91st birthday on June 19.

Mrs. O. D. Garland, admin­
istrator, was a surprised birth­
day honoree Friday when staf­
fers gave her an afternoon 
cake and punch party and 
presented a joint gift. Staffer 
Theresa Fleitman made and 
decorated the cake.

H i l l c r e s t  Auxiliary has 
added a new member Mrs. 
Vernon Sparkman, who was 
with" Mmes. Tony Trubenbach 
Jr., Leonard Endres and Rose 
Hofbauer as hostesses for the 
weekly bingo party last Wed­
nesday.

For Gainesville Airport
Congressman Omar Burle­

son announces approval of a 
Federal Aviation Administra­
tion planning grant of $7,646.00 
to develop an airport master 
plan at the Gainesville Munic­
ipal Airport.

A day of fun for everyone

PICNIC
Thursday, July ❖ 

Muenster City Park
•1 P.M. to 11 P.M.

Refreshments, Fried Chicken, Bar-B-Que 
Cold Drinks, Homemade Ice Cream, Pie

Horse Shoe, Hay Ride, Gam es,
White Elephant Sale, Surprises

Auction at 8 p.m.
Local Organizations will have 
their own concession stands

E v e r y o n e  In v ite d
Sponsored by St. Joseph Society

Local Youths W in  
Honors at State 
CSL Convention

Muenster shared in honors 
at the 76th annual state con­
vention of the Catholic State 
League in San Antonio during 
the weekend.

Barbie Hess won the state 
title of Miss CYO of Texas 
and received a trophy. Lanie 
Yost^n was first in the youth 
essay contest. She received a 
$25 savings bond and a plaque. 
Theme of the essay this year 
was “Why I Must Be Myself.”

Lindsay also shared in hon­
ors. Ronald Hermes w a s  
chosen Mr. CYO of Texas and 
won second place in the essay 
contest. He received a trophy, 
a $10 certificate and a plaque.

Wilfred Bindel, state essay 
chairman, presented awards.

With a theme “Christian 
Living Inspires Unity,” the 
convention got underway Fri­
day, June 14 in El Tropicano 
Motor Hotel and concluded 
there Sunday afternoon. Key­
note • address was given by 
Rev. Msgr. Erwin A. Juras- 
chek pastor of St. Mary’s 
Church, Fredericksburg.

Principal celebrant at the 
concelebrated Mass Sunday 
was the Most Rev. John L. 
Morkovsky, apostolic admin­
istrator, Galveston - Houston 
diocese, with Rt. Rev. Abbot 
Alfred Hoenig, O.S.B., of Cor­
pus Christi one of the six con- 
celebrants. He delivered the 
homily.

It was the 76th annual con­
vention of the Leaue, 73rd for 
the Catholic Life Insurance 
Union, 35th for the youth, and 
60th for the Texas branch of 
the National Catholic Women’s 
Union.

All Texas women who have 
been members of the NCWU 
for 60 years were honored and 
received certificates. F i v e  
from Muenster are in the 
group: Mmes. L. A. Bernauer, 
John Hartman, John Rohmer, 
John Schilling and Frank 
Trachta. T h e i r  certificates 
were brought back by those 
attending.

Present were Messrs, and 
Mmes. Johnny Pagel, Clif 
Sicking, T o m  Swirczynski, 
Roger Taylor, Dennis Hess, 
Arthur Endres, Martin Bayer, 
Harold Knabe, Denis Walter­
scheid, Joe Hoenig and Wil­
fred Bindel, Misses Lynda Ele­
ment, Janet Pels, Gayle Miller, 
Karen Schilling, Lanie Yos- 
tcn and Barbie Hess.

Houston was tentatively 
chosen as the 1975 convention 
city.

W. F. Davidson returned to 
his home at Marysville Tues­
day after a visit in Wills Point 
with his daughter and son-in- 
law Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Snow 
who brought him back.

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Fisch 
of Chicago, 111., arrived Sat­
urday to join in Father Day 
honors for her father Henry 
Wiesman and are remaining as 
his guests through this week.

Building Notes - -
occupied are those of the John 
Kuppers, on West Sixth, A1 
Wiesman on North Oak, Andy 
Knabe on North Pecan, Lloyd 
Trubenbach southeast o f 
town, Don Ferrali near Ros- 
ston, Chris Cain on North 
Maple, Roger Taylor on North 
Pecan, and Jerry Sadler and 
Harvey Lampkin in the south­
east part of town. The Petef 
McCoy’s house on North Syca­
more is finished, awaiting their 
return from Old Mexico.

More building activity in­
cludes a number of major re­
model and repair jobs. Werner 
Becker is doing extensive re­
novating with new wall panel 
and ceiling and storm win­
dows throughout the house.

Ray Hess is adding a bath, 
installing wall panel and a 
new roof and making general 
repairs.

Gene Hoenig has converted 
an attic to a bedroom and bath 
and did general repair work.

L. W. Powell has built a 
practically new house out of 
the ancient Wilson place west 
of Muenster. The job includes 
new siding and roof, interior 
panel board, insulation, cab­
inets, plumbing, heat and air 
conditioning.

Kenny Fette has installed 
central heating and cooling 
and an outside paint job.

Leo Hess has replaced wood 
windows with aluminum win­
dows.

Charles Wimmer Jr. has in­
stalled central heating and 
cooling.

Elbridge Campbell has com­
pletely remodeled an em­
ployee’s home on the ranch.

Mrs. Dick Cain has a new 
roof and Mrs. Theresa Moster 
a new paint job.

Commercial building and 
improvement include an ad­
dition to the back of Fisher’s 
Market for storage space, ex­
terior paint at Shamburger’s, 
and interior paint jobs for the 
high school corridors, gymnas­
ium and auditorium and for 
elementary classrooms at the 
public school.

Mr. and Mrs. John Myrick, 
children Jodie and Dolphy 
and grandson Donald Lee of 
Lake City, Florida, spent last 
week with relatives, his mo­
ther Mrs. T. S. Myrick here, a 
brother Jim Myrick and fam­
ily at Lindsay and her mother 
Mrs. Jewel Wharton and the 
baby’s great-great-grandmo­
ther Mrs. Monte Mask at 
Gainesville. One evening the 
Jim Myricks entertained with 
a charcoal barbecue steak sup­
per at their home. Mr. and 
Mrs. Pat Stelzer missed seeing 
the visitors. He was in Cali­
fornia on buiness and she was 
in San Francisco attending a 
nurses convention.

Mmes. Jack Janicki and Hal 
Falck returned to San Antonio 
Saturday after being here 
since Wednesday evening to 
visit their father Jake Pagel 
and other relatives.

m a m

THE

Specials for June 21-22
i

Hindquarters _ _ . _ lb. 99c 
Round Steak . _ _ _ lb. $1.39
T-Bone Steak _ _ . _ lb. $1.79
Sirloin Steak _ _ _ _ lb. $1.39
Rump Roast . . _ _ lb. $1.09
Pikes Peak Roast . - .lb. $1.09

CHOICE BEEF
from our own feed lot 

for your freezer.

Whole Carcass, Halves, Quarters.

W e also will slaughter & 
custom process your animal.

N O W  OPEN ALL DAY SATURDAY
e8 88 S a 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 8 «8 g 8 8 8 e«8 8 8 8 8 g g 8 »

H&W Meat Co.
Muenster. 759-2744

£>  4-H Club 
News

by Ava Knapp
Several Muenster and Lind­

say 4-Hers Were among the 
31 youths from Cooke County 
competing at the 1974 Texas 
4-H Roundup in College Sta­
tion, June 4 and 5. Approxi­
mately 15,000 4-Hers repre­
senting every county in the 
State were on hand to partici­
pate in the 30 different events, 
ranging from Clothing to 
Farm and Ranch Management. 
To compete at the State level, 
4-Hers must win both their 
county and district contests.

Local youths competing at 
Roundup include Barbie Dav­
idson and Mary Lou Fleitman, 
D a i r y  Demonstration, 4th 
place; Delores Sandmann, Na­
tural Resources, 9th out of 
18; Albert and Deryl Zimmer- 
er, Natural Resources; Sandy 
Reiter and Stacie Walter­
scheid, Farm and Ranch Man­
agement; Gayle Miller and 
Sharon Rohmer, Community 
Improvement; and Paul Rei­
ter and Doyle Element, Field 
Crops. The Rifle Team, com­
posed of Billy Felderhoff, 
Chris Felderhoff, Jack Dangle- 
mayr, and Gary Fetsch, won 
12th out of a possible 24 places. 
Doug Schmitz and Mike Dav­
idson were among members of 
the Livestock Judging Team 
taking 11th place out of a 
total of 24. The Dairy Judging 
Team won 11th out of 24 
places. Members of this team 
include John Henscheid, Jim 
Luke, Deryl Walterscheid, and

Confetti —
fits and burdens? There would 
be fewer give away funds — 
but less need of them — and, 
of course, a lot less of the 
oppressive nuisance exercised 
by bureaucrats. Let’s not let 
them tell us thait we need all 
the supervision that’s being 
dished out by the government. 
We know better, because we 
know that our ancestors grew 
and prospered without official 
direction for 150 years.
Leon Bayer. David Nortman, 
was on the Grass Judging 
Team which won first place in 
the State Competition.

Congratulations to these 
fine 4-Hers whose hard work 
certainly paid off.

4 9 4
The annual local 4-H record 

book workshop was held Wed­
nesday, June 12, in Muenster 
TP&L community room. Led 
by Ava Knapp and Randy Jor­
dan, assistant county Exten­
sion agents, the group dis­
cussed various changes of re­
cord keeping that occurred 
during the past year and the 
method of putting a book to­
gether. Record books are due 
early in July.

Attending were Chris, Billy, 
Rose Mary and Susie Felder­
hoff, Pat and Amy Davidson, 
Larry and Charlotte Fleitman, 
and Sandy Reiter and mothers 
Mme s .  Thomas Felderhoff, 
Charles Davidson, Eddie Fleit­
man and Wilfred Reiter.

Mrs. A1 Kuhn and Laurie of 
St. Louis divided five days 
between relatives here and at 
Lindsay. Mr. and Mrs. Kuhn 
are in Dallas now for three 
days of convention and will be 
back here for the weekend.
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