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Bishop Cassata presiding at ground breaking for new 
parish hall.

Part of crowd at ground breaking. Present hall in 
background.

Regarding ihe city referen­
dum on Saturday, October 27, 
this column proposes to pre­
sent a num ber of im portant 
facts from the engineering re ­
port published in three recent 
issues of the Enterprise and 
give local voters an opportun­
ity to decide what course they 
w ant the council to take.

First of all, one detail should 
be pointed out. The purpose 
is not to confirm or reject a 
w ater district. That m atter has 
already been settled by the 
state legislature. The district 
is created. The thing to be de­
cided is w hat the city council 
will do w ith the district. As 
determ ined in a recent council 
meeting, the city now is ask­
ing residents whether they ap­
prove prompt action on a res­
ervoir or postponement to 
some later date.

The engineers' report leaves 
no doubt that Muenster, along 
with a great area of North 
Texas, faces a future water 
crisis. The day is surely com­
ing when our supply of w ater 
from the Trinity formation 
will not be sufficient to meet 
the demand. Then we’ll have 
to tu rn  to another source for 
some or all of our water.

According to the engineers 
study the top level of w ater in 
the city’s wells varies from 
300 to 360 feet and depth of 
rem aining available w ater ex­
tends 130 to 150 feet below that 
level. I t’s also estim ated that 
the annual rate of drop in wa­
ter level is 5 to 10 feet. So the 
engineers expect the present 
wells to hold out 10 to 20 years.

Compared with the city’s ex­
perience, this is rushing the 
crisis a bit. Well records here 
show a drop of about 80 feet 
in the level since 1951, slightly 
less than 4 feet a year. But, 
allowing for an inevitable in­
crease of consumption, it’s still 
likely that wells will go dry 
some time between 10 and 20 
years.

Definitely that is sufficient
reason to look ahead. When 
the tim e comes we w ant to 
have other w ater available. 
The source of that supply, the 
engineers advise, should be a 
city reservoir just beyond the 
northw est corner of the city.

IA that regard the city has 
an opportunity to get some­
thing extra for its money. In 
cooperation with flood control 
and recreation programs it can 
arrange a cost sharing deal 
with the Soil Conservation 
Service. M uenster would pay 
for the portion used as a wa­
ter reservoir and SCS for the 
additional capacity to be used 
for flood control and recrea­
tion. The city’s share of con­
struction is estimated at $640,- 
000, and the SCS share at $627,- 
000.

The financing program  is
the reason behind creation of 
a w ater district. As a separate 
political entily it is em ­
powered to take on the obliga­
tion and sell its bonds to fed­
eral and state agencies, then 
sell the w ater to pay off its 
debt. It was pointed out that 
this method does not legally 
hinder the city’s eligibility to 
take on other bonded obliga­
tions, however there can be 
no doubt that the debt load 
would hamper ability to pay 
on other obligations.

The engineer’s report indi­
cates that debt service would 
cost $44,000 a year, which pre­
sumably will be raised by the 
sale of 750,000 gallons a day 
at 16 cents per 1000 gallons, a 
stupendous volume by compar­
ison with current average con­
sumption of about 300,000 a 
day. The low now is about 150,- 
000 and the peak about 450,000 
gallons. All of which indicates 
that the rate  would probably 
go considerably over 16 cents.

The annual paym ent of $44,- 
000 is for the complete system, 
which includes $250,000 for 
treatm ent plant plus pipes and 
pumps to move w ater to the 
city. Added to the city’s share 
of reservoir cost, this requires 
an outlay of about $900,000.

However treatm ent plant, 
pipe and pump are to be de­
layed until actually neqded. 
And that according to the en­
gineers will probably be 10 to 

• 20 years.
But as soon as the lake is 

finished the payments on it. 
would be due to start. Dis­
counting for the $250,000 not 
yet invested the annual pay­
ment would be reduced to al­
most $32,000.

As stated before, this amount 
would have to come out of wa­
ter sales, which means adding 
the amount to the present an­
nual w ater bill of $72,000. To 
raise that much, rates would 
have to go up about 40 per cent 
— and probably that would 
cause curtailm ent of w ater use, 
w ith the city still falling short 

(Continued on Page 10)

J. W. Morrisons 
Are Honored on 
50th Anniversary

Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Morrison 
celebrated their golden wed­
ding anniversary Sunday, Oct. 
14, at their home, 618 N. Cedar, 
where friends called through­
out the day.

The couple’s two children 
Mrs. Harold Hurst of Houston 
and W. A. Morrison of Hobbs, 
N. M., and their families hosted 
the observance. They served 
punch and a three-tier decor­
ated anniversary cake.

The former Odessa Akers 
and Will Morrison were m ar­
ried in Sweetwater on Oct. 15, 
1923, and have lived in M uen­
ster 25 years. He is a retired 
Texaco employee h a v i n g  
worked for the company 37 
years. Parents of three chil­
dren, they lost a daughter, Mrs. 
Nan Slaughter soon after mov­
ing to Muenster.

They have seven grand­
children, five were present 
Sunday, and five great-grand­
children with four of them 
present. Also present were 
Mrs. Morrison’s sister Mrs. 
Sinia Nowlin of Robert Lee, 
Mr. M orrison’s brother Tom 
Morrison of Breckenridge and 
his sister Mrs. Myrtle Scott of 
Moran.

The goldenweds are m em ­
bers of Muenster First Baptist 
Church and the congregation 
rem embered them with a gift 
of a money tree. Those who 
called at the home brought 
other anniversary gifts. Mrs. 
Morrison received an orchid 
corsage from her children who 
also remembered their father 
with a boutonniere.

Mrs. Hurst continues to visit 
her parents this week rem ain­
ing after her family returned 
to Houston. W. A. Morrison 
was a week”s visitor before 
the celebration coming ahead 
of his family.

Band to Compete 
In Tishomingo's 
Marching Contest

M uenster High School’s Hor­
net Band will be in Tishimin- 
go, Okla., Saturday competing 
in that city”s third annual in­
vitational marching contest and 
parade.

First on the dual event pro­
gram is a down-town parade 
starting at 10 o’clock. Next is 
the marching contest at the 
football field, presenting rou­
tines similar to half time shows 
at football games.

Eleven bands are participat­
ing, two from Texas and nine 
from Oklahoma. They are clas­
sified as A. B, C and D accord­
ing to enrollm ent of the 
schools represented. M uenster 
is in Class D.

First and second place tro­
phies will be awarded in each 
class for the parade and the 
field contest.

Tigers Encounter 
Big Challenge at 
Lake Worth High

After six easy games in a 
row, the Sacred Heart Tigers 
face a touch one this week. 
As Coach Bob Steele sees it, 
this one definitely is his team ’s 
biggest challenge of the season 
to date.

Lake Worth Junior Varsity 
is big and rugged and potent 
on both offense and defense. 
It has been scored on only 
once, and has wins over four 
junior varsity teams including 
Keller, Bridgeport and Deca­
tur. All of those are big Class 
AA schools with lots of talent 
left over for their second 
teams.

I t’s possible too that the 
team will get help from its 
varsity in Friday’s game. 
Since the varsity has an open 
date some of its players who 
missed a previous game will 
be eligible for this one.

However it seems that the 
regular team  hardly needs 
help, considering that the  line 
averages 190 pounds and the 
back field is speedy.

On the other hand the Tig­
ers too are potent. Though 
lighter in the line they have 
comparable speed. Their six 
decisive wins leave no doubt 
that they are ready for strong 
competition.

The game will be at Lake 
Worth Friday night starting at 
8 p.m. For the benefit of 
Tiger fans attending, Coach 
Steele suggests the route that 
was given to him by the Lake 
W orth coach. That is to leave 
I-35W at the first exit to the 
right after passing Loop 820. 
The street is Long Ave., a 4 
lane road. Follow it about 15 
miles to the stadium  which is 
two or three blocks beyond 
Jacksboro Highway.

City Cleanup 
Set Nov. 5-10

November 5-10 has been set 
as cleanup, paintup and fixup 
week for M uenster.

T hat’s the announcement 
from the Ecology Committee 
of M uenster Garden Club.

The sponsors are urging co­
operation of every person in 
town. Trucks to haul trash and 
workers to pick it up will be 
available. Residents who need 
help are being asked to call 
759-4497 or 759-4228 for fu r­
ther information.

SH Seventh Grade 
Ties Callisburg

Seventh graders of Sacred 
Heart in their first football ac­
tion of the season settled for a 
6-6 tie with the little kids of 
Callifeburg. %

Bert Hesse put Sacred Heart 
on the scoreboard with a fine 
70 yard gallop.

Callisburg blocked a punt to 
set u p its opportunity then 
went in for the tying touch­
down.

Bishop Officiates 
Ground Breaking 
For Parish Center

Bishop John J. Cassata of the 
Fort Worth Diocese removed 
the first shovel of d irt in 
ground - breaking ceremonies 
for construction of the Sacred 
Heart Parish’s new community 
center.

The ceremony was held 
Sunday at 6:30 p.m., preced­
ing Mass with confirmation at 
7 p.m., before a crowd of sev­
eral hundred parish members.

Others who manned the 
“gold” shovels to break the 
ground were pasters Father 
Placidus Eckart and Father 
Stephen Eckart; and visiting 
clergy, Father Bede Mitchel of 
Lindsay, Father H arry Fisher 
of Burkburnett, Father An­
thony Gajda of Valley View 
and Father Eugene Witkowski 
of Fort W orth; also members 
of the Sacred Heart building 
and finance commissions.

Plans and specifications for 
the new $300,000 parish hall 
have been approved and con­
struction is due to begin be­
fore the first of the year. It 
will be located just east of the 
present hall, which has served 
the community since 1906. Af­
ter it is finished the old build­
ing will be removed and the 
area used as a parking pot.

Tigers Demolish 
Callisburg 40-6 
At Homecoming

Sacred H eart Tigers were 
going strong again Saturday 
night and a cheering crowd of 
homecoming fans loved them 
as they rolled over Callisburg’s 
Wildcats 40-6. The score could 
have been considerably high­
er but Coach Steele shut it off 
early in the third quarter and 
let his reserves have most of 
the action.

Though the night was clear 
and dry following Friday’s 
heavy rain, the game was mes­
sy. Before the end, parts of the 
wet field were churned into 
a mudhole. At times the runs 
were cut short because of the 
slippery footing.

Nevertheless t h e  Tigers 
found enough secure tu rf to 
roll up 248 rushing yards plus 
36 through the air while the 
visitors got a total of only 35.

Following a clipping penalty 
on the opening kickoff Sacred 
Heart was 71 yards away, but 
that was fine with Dickie Mos- 
ter who ot around right end 
on the first offensive play and 
went all the way. The kick for 
extra point failed. The Tigers 
led 6-0 w ith only 21 seconds 
gone on the clock.

A fumble o n Callisburg’s 
first offensive play set up an 
opportunity 41 yards away but 
the drive stalled on the first 
series. However it was differ­
ent when the Cats fumbled 
again a few plays later. Mark 
Hess, Kevin Pels and Moster 
gained 21 on three plays, then 
Moster busted through the 
middle for 19 and the second 
TD.

Shortly after that the visi­
tors got a num ber of breaks, 
five in a row. F irst Tony 
Strickland intercepted. Then 
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Tibbets Sponsors 
Tour of Pastures 
On October 23

Farm ers and ranchers of this 
area are invited next W ednes­
day, October 24, to join in a 
tour of pastures sponsored by 
County Agent Neil Tibbets. It 
will be conducted by George 
Sultemeier, a r e a  agronomist 
of the Texas A&M Extension 
Service, who will discuss m er­
its of the several varieties.

The tour begins at 2 p.m. on 
the A1 Felderhoff farm 3 miles 
northw est of Muenster. The 
program there was started 
seven years ago under direc­
tion of Texas Research Foun­
dation which is now a part of 
Texas A&M U n i v e r s i t y .  
Grasses featured there are De 
Soto, Bermuda and Ermello 
Lovegrass.

Next stop will be at the .Voth 
Brothers farm two miles south 
of M uenster to see a planting 
of Renner Lovegrass. And the 
third stop will be at the Pulte 
farm w e s t  of Gainesville. 
Grasses on display there will 
be Bermuda and Lovegrass.

Persons attending are asked 
to gather at the Felderhoff 
farm and go in a group from 
there to the second and third 
stops. Car pools are encour­
aged.

KC Good Neighbor 
Award Presented 
To Albert Lippe

Albert Lippe, local repre­
sentative of Lone S tar Gas 
Company, is this year’s K of C 
selection for its Good Neigh­
bor Award, which has been 
presented for the past ten 
years to some local person of 
another faith.

In his short presentation re ­
m arks Grand Knight Eddie 
Fleitman said tha t Lippe has 
demonstrated the spirit of 
neighborliness and inter-faith  
good will during five years of 
friendly association in the 
community. Father Placidus 
Eckart, pastor, said that the 
award is in keeping with the 
current ecumenical aim of 
promoting b et t e r  relations 
among the faiths.

The award is a wooden 
plaque created by the Bavar­
ian Wood Carving Studio. It 
has the emblems of the KCs 
and Lone Star Gas w ith an in­
scription designating Lippe as 
the council’s selection as good 
neighbor of 1973.

Hornets Splash to 
18-0 Homecoming 
Win over Bobcats

A sloppy field and a con­
stant drizzle were a poor set­
ting for homecoming festivi­
ties, but the perform ance of 
the Hornets compensated to a 
great degree. They did a fine 
job in blanking Newcastle’s 
Bobcats 18-0.

Because of the ugly w ea­
ther the ceremony of crowning 
the homecoming queen was 
postponed until the dance fol­
lowing the game. Her Royal 
Majesty was Shirley Swirczyn- 
ski elected by the football 
team from a slate of four nom­
inated by the senior class.

The Hornets made an ex­
plosive start by scoring on the 
first play of their first posses- 
on the 32 after several short 
gains. Then Curtis Klement 
picked a hole in the right side 
of the line and went all the 
way.

The night was a great -one 
for Klement who alone ac 
counted for 137 yards of Muen- 
ster’s total rushing before go- 

(Continued on Page 10)

Reservoir Pros, Cons 
Aired in City Meeting

Discussion of the proposed 
water reservoir for M uenster 
was the principal "happening 
of the city council’s regular 
meeting Monday night. The 
consensus of their rem arks 
was that there is no question 
about whether the lake will be

One of State's 
Hottest A Teams 
Awaits Hornets

The biggest job of the sea­
son confronts the MHS Hor­
nets Friday as they open their 
14-A action with Frisco’s super 
powerful Coons.

It’s the Num ber 3 Class A 
team of the state according 
to AP, and Num ber 7 accord­
ing to the Harris rating. And 
it is not over rated, in the 
opinion of Coach Glenn Rich­
ardson. He regards the team 
as the answer to a Coach’s 
dream, a fortunate circum ­
stance in which an abundance 
of talent is grouped together 
for one season. The team  has 
size, speed and experience — 
featuring fourteen seniors now 
playing their fourth season to­
gether. And they have a per­
fect record.

To say tha t the Hornets are 
underdogs is an understate­
ment. According to the signs 
their mission is impossible. 
Thei game plan according to 
Glenn Richardson, is to give it 
all they have and hope for a 
miracle. Win or lose they in­
tend to give a good account of 
themselves.

Physically and m entally the 
Hornets are ready. They came 
through last w eek’s game with 
only a few bruises and they 
have ambitions of springing a 
surprise op the highly favored 
Coons.

Game time is 8 p.m., a t Fris­
co.

Muenster Has 26 
Winners in County 
4-H Project Fair

Seventy-three 4-Hers from 
throughout Cooke County en­
tered their completed projects 
in 17 categories at the first an ­
nual Cooke County 4-H Pro­
ject Fair held Sat., Oct. 13 in 
the Old Gainesville National 
Bank Building.

The Project Fair is a new 
activity designed for 4-H pro­
jects that don’t already have 
a ribbon activity. Prem ium  
money and ribbons were p re­
sented to the top three places 
in each category with the pro­
jects being on display to the 
public all day Saturday. Each 
category was divided into ju n ­
ior and senior divisions.

Twenty six of the w inners 
were members of the Muen­
ster Community and Sacred 
Heart Clubs. They and their 
categories are as follows.

Entomology, Jr., Lloyd Rei­
ter, 2.

Conservation, Sr., Billy Fel­
derhoff, 1, Barbie Davidson, 2.

Woodworking, Jr., Mike Bay­
er, 1. Sr. Garry Fetsch, 1, Chris 
Felderhoff, 3.

Safety, Sr., Sandy Reiter, 1; 
Billy Felderhoff, 2.

Recreation, Jr., Elaine Wal- 
terscheid, 1. Sr., Chris Felder­
hoff. 1; Barbarie Davidson, 2.

Needlework, Jr., Mary Roh­
mer, 2. Sr., Mary Lou F leit­
man, 1; Barbie Davidson, 3.

Arts and Crafts, Sr., Sharon 
Voth, 1.

Ornam ental Flowers, Jr., 
Monica Hartman, 2.

Creative Arts, Sr. Pat Dav­
idson, 3.

Crochet, Sr., Barbie Hess, 2; 
Pat Davidson, 3.

Mini-Garden, Sr., Chris Fel­
derhoff, 1; Sandy Reiter, 2.

Home Living, Jr., Charlotte 
Fleitman, 2. Sr., Monica H art­
man, 1; Mary Lou Fleitman, 2.

Photography, Jr., Rose Fel­
derhoff, 1.

Miscellaneous, Sr., Barbie 
Davidson, 2.

needed, but only how soon.
Mayor David Bright said 

the city’s intention until now 
has been to develop a solution 
to the coming problem and let 
the public determ ine if and 
when the step is to be taken. 
He further stated that a town 
hall type of meeting will be 
arranged if the people wish to 
have a full explanation of the 
situation.

Discussion at the council 
meeting brought out the fact 
that the problem involves both 
quality and quantity of water. 
Records show that the water 
level is declining, and there 
have been signs of hardness or 
pollution by salt and oil.

The council acknowledges 
that a big decision faces the 
voters. They may be taking 
on a big expense in providing 

facility that may not be 
needed for several years, or 
they may be risking a water 
crisis.

Also discussed was the 
garbage and trash disposal sys­
tem. The city has definitely 
decided to operate the service 
itself but it still workihg on a 
num ber of related details. 
Charge apparently will be 
based on the customer’s sewer 
charge, but there are questions 
on frequency of collection, 
plastic or paper bags, the area 
to be used for landfill, etc. The 
intention is prepare as well as 
possible in order to avoid later 
adjustments.

Weekend law enforcement 
received brief attention. Ex­
perience is showing that there 
is too much activity here on 
Friday and Saturday to be 
supervised by one policeman. 
The council is considering an 
assistant for him on the busy 
nights.

Schedule of 
Football Games

The following football games 
of the two local schools are on 
schedule for the coming week.

Thurs., Oct. 18, 7:00, Frisco 
B at Muenster.

Fri., Oct. 19, 8:00, MHS Hor­
nets at Frisco.

Fri., Oct. 19, 8:00, SH Tigers 
at Lake Worth Jr. Varsity.

Tues., Oct. 23, 6:45 Era Ju n ­
iors at Sacred Heart.

Tues., Oct. 23, 6:00, M uenster 
Juniors at Sanger.

Thurs., Oct. 25, 7:00, M uen­
ster B at Sanger.

Thurs., Oct. 25, 5:00, SH 7th, 
8th and Tiger B at Celina.

1.84 Inch Rain
People at last Friday’s foot­

ball game probably will not 
believe this, but all of the w et­
ness came from only 1.84 
inches of rain. That was the of­
ficial measure on Steve Mos- 
te r’s gauge at 7 a.m. Saturday 
for the rainfall that started 
shortly after noon Friday and 
kept coming at least until af­
ter the game.

Present measure for the 
month is 3.81 inches, the total 
for the year to date is 41.59.

A Proclamation
W hereas, The Catholic Daughters of America 

is a  national organization with purposes exclusive­
ly religious, charitable and educational; and

W hereas, The Catholic Daughters of America 
has been active in Sacred Heart Parish -for nearly 
fifty-nine years; and

W hereas, The National Board has designated 
a  special day, Sunday, October 21 as  "National 
Catholic Daughters of America Day" in order to 
acquaint the people of our Nation with the Order, 
its aims, purposes and accomplishments; therefore 
be it RESOLVED, That the City Council designate 
Sunday, October 21, as Catholic Daughters of Amer­
ica Day in Muenster.

David Bright, Mayor

Junior Hi Teams 
Face Tough Games

Junior teams of both Muen­
ster schools have big assign­
m ents for next Tuesday night 
when they take on the toughest 
competition of their respective 
loops.

The Tiger Cubs, w ith a per­
fect record in the first round 
of their double round robin, 
are looking for their second 
win over Era. A loss by Sac­
red H eart would give the two 
teams a tie for top position. 
The game will be here at 6:45.

The Little Monsters, w ith a 
win over Frisco to their credit, 
will have a big job at Sanger. 
The Little Indians are highly 
rated and the Little Monsters 
have just lost their first string 
quarterback, N i c k  W alter- 
scheid, w ith a broken collar 
bone. Nick’s twin brother, Neil, 
is next in line for the job.

Special Events by 
Local Court Will 
Observe CDA Day

Court St. Mary Catholic 
Daughters of America, Sacred 
Heart Parish, will join CDA 
members throughout the na­
tion in observance of National 
Catholic Daughters of America 
Day, Sunday, Oct. 21.

Plans for the observance 
were completed at the court’s 
October meeting and will fea­
ture a religious and a social 
event. Husbands will be guests.

Group attendance at 7 p.m. 
Mass will be followed by a 
buffet supper and dance in the 
KC Hall.

In other action members set 
the dates of their annual bene­
fit bake sale, November 9 and 
19, and assumed sponsorship 
of the annual CDA poetry con­
test in which the local court 
offers cash prizes for winners 
and forwards top entries to 
state competition. Mrs. Steve 
Moster is chairman. Students 
of both local schools have been 
invited to participate w riting 
on a religious theme. Contest 
deadline is Feb. 15, 1974.

Members also naifted a pro­
gram committee consisting of 
Mmes. Ray Wilde, Alvin Fuhr- 
man and M artin Kralicke.

Father Placidus Eckart, court 
chaplain, met w ith the group 
and, for the program, gave a 
book review of “Man’s Search 
f o r  Meaning,” by Viktor 
Frankl, Austrian Jew. His book 
includes details of his confine­
ment in two m ajor concentra­
tion camps during the Nazi 
regime.

Miss Dorothy Bengfort, re ­
gent, presided for business and 
Mrs. Harold Knabe, lecturer, 
served refreshm ents to  30 
members after adjournm ent.
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A ny erroneous reflec tion  upon  
th e  ch arac te r, s tand ing  o r re p u ­
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upon being b ro u g h t to  th e  a t ­
ten tion  of th e  P ub lisher.

"Fire . . .
Explosion . . .
Robbery . . .
Accident!"

Both homeowner and ten­
ant can be protected for des- 
tructicon of property and 
personal belongings — crime 
losses — and personal lia­
bility risks. The answer is 
a package Homeowner or 
Tenants Policy at reasonable 
premium from FMW Agency.
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Local News
BRIEFS

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Bay­
er and Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Schwab and son A. J., all of 
Dallas came home to join their 
parents the George Bayers at 
S H homecoming festivities. 
Mrs. Schwab was one of the

honored graduates. They all 
returned home that night. Sun­
day Mr. and Mrs. Bayer and 
Cheryl went to Dallas to join 
them in attending dedication 
of St. Joseph’s Home of which 
Mr. Schwab is administrator.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Gres- 
sett of Carrollton were with 
the SH homecoming crowd 
Saturday. They and their chil­
dren were weekend guests of 
her parents, the Lawrence 
Wimmers.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. John­
nie French last week were his 
son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob French of Fort Smith, 
Ark. They were enroute to 
Las Vegas, Nev.

W eekending w ith Mr. and 
Mrs. Leonard Endres were 
their son-in-law and daughter 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Henning of 
Lawton, Okla. The young 
couple took time out Saturday 
to drive to Dallas to attend 
the Texas-Oklahoma football 
game.

Mr. and Mrs. Rod Everett of 
Nogales, Ariz., were visitors in 
Muenster Monday afternoon 
through Tuesday. They were 
houseguests of his aunt Mrs. 
Andy Hofbauer and the W al­
ter families gathered there 
Monday evening for a get-to 
gether.

Christening service was held 
Sunday in Sacred H e a r t

Custom & 
Ready Made 
DRAPERIES

Expert Installation 
Available

Hess Furniture 
& Western Auto

Church for Jennifer Ann Wal­
ter, infant daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Chris W alter. Father 
Stephen Eckart officiated. Mr. 
and Mrs. Rodney W alter of 
Dallas are their niece’s god­
parents. Standing in for them 
as proxies were the paternal 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Oscar W alter. O thers a ttend­
ing w ere the baby’s parents, 
her brother Michael and sister 
Michelle.

Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Hess 
have named their new daugh­
ter Julie Ann. She was bap­
tized in Sacred H eart Church 
by Father Stephen Eckart as­
sisted by Mr. and Mrs. Ken­
neth Bierschenk, baby’s uncle 
and aunt, as godparents. Also 
present were the parents and 
their other children Brian and 
Kimberly.

Mr. and Mrs. Teddy Miller, 
Brian, Darrell and Amy of 
Plano spent the weekend with 
parents and grandparents, the 
J. H. Wimmers and T. Miller. 
They were among the crowd 
at SHH Homecoming Saturday 
and among guests at a b irth ­
day party for his “father Sun­
day.

Doug Otto of Irving Was 
back for a visit Sunday and 
Monday with homefolks.

SHH Students to 
Take Special Test

This m onth sophomores, jun ­
iors and some seniors of Sac­
red H eart High School will 
have the opportunity to join 
over one million other students 
around the world in taking 
the Prelim inary Scholastic Ap­
titude Test — National Merit 
Scholarship Qualifying Test, an 
im portant step in m aking col­
lege plans.

T o be given at SHH on Oc­
tober 23, the test is designed 
to measure verbal and m athe­
matical aptitude — two abil­
ities that research has shown 
to be im portant in doing cpl- 
lege work. In addition to help­
ing a student find out more 
about himself and his abilities, 
the test can lead to other op­
portunities.

Three Share in 
Birthday Honor

There w ere three birthday 
honorees at a dinner in Den­
ton, Oct. 7, in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Dickie Cain who 
were hosts. Having birthdays 
last week and observing them 
early were Mrs. N orbert Kle- 
ment, Jam es Otto and Mrs. 
Dickie Cain.

Other guests w ere Norbert 
Klement, M uenster, Mr s .  
Jam es Otto and daughter Lin­
da of Garland, Mrs. J. E. M arr 
and sons Jim m y and Pat of 
Fort Worth and the Cain chil­
dren Tami, Troy, Scott and 
Shauna.

Schumachers Are 
Complimented on 
25th Anniversary

Tw enty-fifth wedding anni­
versary of Mr. and Mrs. Rich­
ard Schumacher of Gainesville 
was celebrated at a covered 
dish dinner hosted by their 
children on Oct. 6 in the home 
of their daughter Barbara and 
husband the Skipper Bezners 
at Lindsay.

About 60 guests attended. 
The anniversary cake was 
topped with the same bride 
and groom figurines th a t were 
atop their wedding cake in 
1948. The lower tier of the 
cake was surrounded by figur­
ines representing the honor 
couple’s 14 children. All were 
present except Sister Clarice 
Schumacher who telephoned 
congratulations from Marrero, 
La.

Special guests were the 
couple’s parents Mr. and Mrs. 
Alois Haverkamp of M uenster 
and#Mr. and Mrs. Henry Schu­
macher of Gainesville.

Other guests were from Den­
ton, Dallas, Kemp, W indthorst, 
Wichita Falls, and Altus, Okla., 
and from Cooke County.

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTING

Fixtures
Supplies

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 
Installations, Repairs. 

Appliance Repairs.

Call 665-2721
Nights call 

665-3263 or 665-4456

Parker Electric
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville

New Book Tells 
Story of Olivetan 
Benedictine Nuns

Fresh off the Franciscan 
Herald Press is the delightful 
and interesting history of the 
origin and growth of the Com­
m unity of Olivetan Benedic­
tine Sisters of Jonesboro, A rk­
ansas, “The G r e e n  Olive 
Branch,” w ritten  by Sister M. 
Agnes Voth, of Muenster.

Sister Agnes, a fifty-five 
year mem ber of the comm un­
ity of which she writes was 
well acquainted with the 
foundress, M other M. Beatrice 
and learned first hand of her 
inspirations, goals and aims 
for her community.

The story comes alive as Sis­
ter Agnes relates w ith beauti­
ful simplicity, the struggles, 
trials, joys, sorrows, and dis­
appointments, the humorous, 
and not so humorous events 
and episodes as the four Sis­
ters with 83 cents cash arrived 
in Pocahontas, Arkansas to 
launch the future Community 
of the Olivetan Benedictine 
Sisters.

In 1895, only eight years af­
ter the arrival of the Sisters in 
Pocahontas, three Sisters, two 
Novices and one Oblate, were 
sent to M uenster to staff the 
school. Professor John Luke, 
the parish organist, taught the 
seventh and eighth grades and 
the Sisters took charge of the 
other six grades. Names of 
many famous and fam iliar 
M uenster people are woven in­
to the account of M uenster’s 
growth.

Anyone who wishes a copy 
may place an order by con­
tacting the Olivetan Benedic­
tine Sisters here at the local 
convent or m ay order directly 
from: The Franciscan Herald 
Press, 1434 West 51st Street, 
Chicago, 111. 60609.

The paperback book con­
tains over 300 pages and is 
priced at $7.00. Thirty-three 
pages are devoted to M uenster 
and M uenster people.

Vickie Kay Bayer, infant 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Bayer was baptized 
Sunday in Sacred H e a r t  
Church by Father Stephen 
Eckart. Mr. and Mrs. Herbie 
Knabe attended as godparents 
for their niece. Others present 
were the parents with Deano 
and Amy, and Bert, Tim and 
Stanley Knabe.

W einzapfels Have 
57th Anniversary 
Mass in Scotland

Mr. and Mrs. J. M. Wein- 
zapfel who were married Oct. 
3, 1916, in Scotland, Texas, re­
turned there to observe their 
wedding anniversary in St. 
Boniface Church where they 
pledged their vows 57 years 
ago.

Con-celebrating the 11 a.m. 
Mass were a son Father Joseph 
W einzapfel of Irving and Fa­
ther John Williams of India, a 
guest of the family while he 
is in the states. He came with 
Father W einzapfel to M uen­
ster to take the anniversary 
couple to Scotland. Mrs. Tony 
Gremm inger a c c o m p a n i e d  
them.

Father Cletus Post of W ind­
thorst was present in the san­
ctuary and others at Mass in­
cluded Mr. and Mrs. William 
W einzapfel of W indthorst and 
Mr. and Mrs. Otto Hemmi of 
Scotland.

A fterw ard they ate dinner 
out in a W indthorst restaurant 
where they exchanged pleas­
antries with friends they saw 
there and visited by phone 
w ith other friends.

They revived many m em or­
ies of their days in Scotland 
and W indthorst and saw the 
house where Mrs. Weinzapfel, 
as Ju lia  Meurer, lived. I t is 
across the street from St. 
Boniface Church and now be­
longs to the Scotland parish. 
She is a native of M uenster 
but moved to Scotland at an 
early age with her parents. 
Her husband is a native of 
W indthorst.

They are residents of M uen­
ster since 1923 when he and 
the late John M eurer organized 
M uenster State Bank of which 
he rose from cashier to presi­
dent and since retiring from 
that office serves as chairman 
of the board.

They reared eight children 
— gave two sons to God in the 
priesthood and one to their 
country two days after Pearl 
H arbor when Ensign Robert 
Weinzapfel, Navy pilot, be­
came M uenster’s first casualty 
of World W ar II.

Msgr. Thomas Weinzapfel 
who had planned to be a con- 
celebrant of the Mass, was in 
New Orleans on business. He 
and the couple’s other children 
and families sent greetings 
and congratulations by phone 
or mail, or in person in the

The Fabric Center
Bolts & Bolts of lovely

Fall Material

w

New Nylon unpackaged zippers

New Sweater Knits

for service on all Sewing Machines Call us 
Dorma Flusche, 759-4401, Muenster

Big selection of girls' tops 
And men's shirts & pull-overs

1 Group_____ Buy 1, Get 1 Free
1 Group _r______ Each only $2.00

Big Assortment of Jeans 
Buy 1 and  Get 1 Free

lust Received Big Shipment
of Red Snap Hip Huggers

with cuffs in brown and navy

. . .  also Red Snap Super-Low
with cuffs in light blue

Plaid Pants
with elastic waist-band
Coats & Blazers

«  n \  ■ ■ i l l —  li

301 E. California, Gainesville

case of the Henry W einzap­
fel and David Bright families 
of M uenster. The others are 
Messrs, and Mmes. P. W. Hell- 
man of Bristow, Okla., Hugh 
Jackson of Fort Worth and 
Bill Birden of Lewisville.

Fathers W einzapfel and Wil­
liams returned  to Muenster 
with the Weinzapfels and Mrs. 
Gremm inger a n d  the two 
priests spent overnight at the 
W einzapfel home.

Enroute back to M uenster 
the group stopped in Wichita 
Falls to visit Mrs. W einzapfel’s 
sister Mrs. Maggie Otto, resi­
dent in a nursing home there 
since she has a heart ailment.

Gasoline, OIL 
Supplies 

For Your 
Farm Needs

Jimmy Lehnertz
Gulf Distributor 

665-4562, Gainesville

Or see local dealer 
Ferd's Gulf Station

Trick or Treat Candies 

Imitation Pumpkins 

Party Goods 

Costumes 

Masks

B E N ^ F R A N K U N *
Anthony and Leona Luke

200 N. Denison, Gainesville, Texas

Decorated

Limit 3 Rolls

THRU SATURDAY — WHILE QUANTITIES LAST

Jumbo Roll
160 sheets per roll. Decorated 
borders in assorted colors. 
Strong and super absorbent

Earthen Candle

HOLDER
TTirea different With Candle 
shapes to choose 
from. Assorted 
Colors.

Our Low
Price. . .

i

9" Ironstone Salad

BOWLS
6 Assorted designs. Pick yours out today 
and save.

Buy i 

Several „

Viva ® Paper
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He who blows his own horn 

seldom is able to listen to the 
band.

The best reason for working 
your tail off today is . . . To­
morrow!

Children's Fall & Winter 
Clothes

COATS - JACKETS - SWEATERS
boys through size 16, girls through 14

Use Our Lay Away
* (

The Tree House
312 E. California, Gainesville

Lindsay News

LINDSAY — Mr. and Mrs. 
Alfred Hoedebeck of Irving 
were Sunday visitors w ith her 
parents, the A. C. Flusches. 
Mrs. Flusche is back at home 
after being a hospital patient.

Miss Doris Hundt is Home­
coming Queen 1973 at Lindsay, 
crowned Friday night in cere­
monies at half-time of the 
Knights-Valley View Eagles 
football game. It was a gala 
homecoming in spite of rain 
with the Knights on the big end 
of an 18-6 score. O ther queen 
candidates who were prin­
cesses in the royal court were 
Carol Zimmerer, Donna Zim- 
m erer and Joyce Neu, all four 
are seniors. Last year’s queen 
Judy Beyer Secrest partici­
pated in ceremonies. Gradu­
ates of 1940 and 1964 were hon-

Save Money! 
Save Time!

Prescription Is Our 
Middle Name.

Shop the 
Drive-in Window 

for all your prescriptions 
and drug needs.

W A T T S  
Prescription Shop

302 N. Grand, Gainesville

ored during the game.

Lindsay Future Farm ers of 
America have nom inated can­
didates for FFA Sw eetheart 
and the one who can secure 
the most votes by collecting 
the most money will be win­
ner. Candidates are Donna 
Zimmerer, s e n i o r ;  Melinda 
Bezner, junior; Barbara Zim­
merer, sophomore; Mary Fel- 
derhoff, freshman.

Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Dulock 
of Buena Vista, Colo., have 
been back in the area to visit 
relatives including t h e i r  
daughter and family the Alvin 
Fleitmans a t Gainesville and 
his sister and family, the Nick 
Blocks.

David Zimmerer, young son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Zim­
merer, is back at home recov­
ered from pneumonia th a t put 
him in M uenster Hospital for 
four days.

A lbert Kubis Is 
B irthday Honoree

LINDSAY — Albert Kubis 
had help celebrating his b irth ­
day Sunday w hen the family 
— some 35 of them  — gathered 
at his home with covered 
dishes for supper, birthday 
gifts and a decorated cake.

All the Kubis children were 
present w ith  their families ex­
cept Alcuin Paul Kubis and 
family of Baton Rouge, La.

Coming from  out of town 
were Mr. and Mrs. Buster 
Kubis and daughter Kas3i of 
Broken Bow, Okla., Anthony 
Felderhoff J r. of Denton and 
Miss Darlene Wolf of Sherman.

SH 4-H Club Has 
150 Members In 
Grades 5 thru 12

The Sacred H eart 4-H club is 
made up or 150 young men 
and women from the ages of 
10 to 18 attending the Sacred 
Heart School. Their meetings 
are held on the first W ednes­
day of every month.

The club is divided into 5th 
and 6th, 7th and 8th, and senior 
boys and girls. Since home 
economics and vocational agri­
culture are not offered 1n the 
school the 4-H meetings are a 
part of the school curriculum  
for those that wish to take it.

Each of the age groups 
select their course of study 
with the 5th and 6th and sen­
ior boys studying small en­
gines, the 7th and 8the boys 
learning rifle and rifle safety, 
the 5th and 6th grade girls 
learning crochet techniques, 
the 7th and 8th grade girls 
studying home environm ent 
and the senior girls exploring 
the careers available to young 
women.

The Sacred H eart 4-H Club 
is one of the most active in 
Cooke County w ith participa­
tion coming in every program  
area. The county Share-the- 
Fun eliminations are held at 
the Sacred H eart school along 
w ith eliminations for County 
Method Demonstrations. Mem­
bers of the Sacred H eart 4-H 
club are involved in individual 
projects some of which include 
food and nutrition, livestock, 
clothing, creative arts, field 
crops, home m anagem ent and 
dairy production.

Wednesday Is 
Double Stamp Day

You get twice the usual number ot 
Buccaneer Stamps on W ednesday with the 

purchase ot $5.00 or more in groceries. 
(Cigarettes not included.)

SAVE 50c
on 3 oz. size

INSTANT

N ESTE A'
100% TEA

with coupon 
3-oz. size

94c
without
coupon

$1.44
Limit

1 per family

Good at Fisher's through Saturday, Oct. 20

Carton of 8, 10-oz. bottles

Pepsi Cola _ _ _ _ _ _  59c
plus deposit

Shurfine 46-oz.

Pineapple Juice _ _ _ _ 2 - 69c
Lucky Leaf No. 2 can

Apricot Pie Filling _ _ _ _ 63c 

Instant Sanka, 8-oz. _ _ _ $ 1.99
With 25c coupon inside, good on 

next purchase

fy > io y ze + t

Birds Eye, 9-oz.

Cool Whip _ _ _ _ _ _
Morton 10-oz.

Mini-Donuts, 18 _ _ _ _

49c

49c
Ida Treat, 5-lb. pkg. v

French Fried Potatoes _ _ 98c

H O M E  F E D  &  H O M E  KILLED

Good Beef
for your freezer

WHOLE or HALF CARCASS

M eo tl
From home fed and 

home killed beef

Club Steak 

lb. $1.89

Rib Steak

lb. $1.29

Blade cut

Chuck Roast 

lb. 79c

Calf Liver 

lb. 49c

Sliced, Frozen

Pork Liver 

lb. 39c

Produce

Reg. 99c Style

Balsam Hair Spray _ _ _ _ 69c
Reg. 79c, 15-oz. Style Herbal Balsam

Creme Rinse _ _ _ _ _ i v
© o

Reg. 79c, 11-oz.

Colgate Shave Cream _ _ 1 o

NEW! Reg. $1.29, 4-oz. Vaseline

After Shave Care _ _ _ _ 79c

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1-lb. Coffeemate 
Coffee Creamer

Void after Saturday, October 20

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

2 20-oz. bottles 
Del Monte Catsup

Void after Saturday, October 20

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 25-oz. jar Dorr County 
Apple Sauce

Void after Saturday, October 20

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 4-oz. pkg. McCormick 
Black Pepper

Void after Saturday, October 20

Phone 759-4211

FISHER'
MARKET & GROCERY

Bananas 

2-lb. 25c

Texas Oranges

5-lb. 59c

Radishes 

bag 10c

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 roll 20-ft. x 12-in. 
Reynolds Wrap Foil

Void after Saturday, October 20

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 pkg. of 10 pads 
Brillo Soap Pads

Void after Saturday, October 20

Local Franciscan 
Third Order Has 
Officer Election

Members of the Third O r­
der of St. Francis, Sacred 
Heart Parish, at their October 
meeting Sunday elected offi­
cers for a new term  and set 
the dates for a joint workshop 
w ith tertiaries of St. M ary’s 
Parish, Gainesville, and St. 
P e ter”s Parish, Lindsay.

Before the business session 
in Sacred Heart L ibrary m em ­
bers assembled in Sacred 
Heart Church for the order’s 
divine office, led by Mrs. Leo 
Henscheid, prefect, and an ad­
dress by Father Placidus Eck- 
art. His topic was “Faith.”

In the election, members re ­
tained Mrs. Henscheid as pre­
fect, named Mrs. F rank Bayer 
to succeed Mrs. F rank Herr as 
vice prefect, elected Mrs. Felix 
Yosten treasurer to replace 
Mrs. Joe Fisher, chose Miss Lu 
Vogel to continue as secretary 
and kept Mrs. R. R. Endres as 
mistress of novices.

Members learned of the 
three-fraternity  w o r k s h o p  
through a le tte r from Father 
Bennett Funk, Franciscan, as­
sistant provincial of the order, 
province of Chicago, who has 
been delegated to work with 
southen fra tern ity  groups of 
Texas, Oklahoma and Louisi­
ana.

He will conduct the w ork­
shop in M uenster on the even­
ings of November 6 and 7 be­
ginning at 7 o’clock.

In other business, members 
changed their weekly holy 
hour time from 3 p.m. to 2:30 
p.m. Non-m em bers are invited 
to attend this service.

B e f o r e  adjourning Mrs. 
Henscheid r e a d  letters of 
thanks from the Devasseys 
and Dominis, the local fra te r­
nity’s two adopted families in 
India.

3 County 4-Hers 
Are State Winners 
On Record Books

Three 4-H members from 
Cooke County were big w in­
ners at the State Record Book 
Judging held recently in Col­
lege Station. K i m Reiter, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. W il­
fred Reiter of M uenster, was 
first alternate with her record 
book in  Home M anagement 
while Sandy Reiter, also the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Wil­
fred Reiter, placed in the first 
quarter with her record book 
in Consumer Education. Nancy 
Hickman, the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Milton Hickman of 
Sivells Bend, placed in the 
third quarter of the Citizen­
ship Division.
- These three young ladies 
earned the right to go to the 
State judging by w inning their 
divisions a t County and Dis­
trict. F i r s t  place w inner 
from the State Judging earned 
a trip  to the National 4-H Con­
gress to he held November 25- 
29 in Chicago.

The 4-H Record Book gives 
the 4-Hers an opportunity to 
show the projects, activities, 
and leadership areas th a t they 
have worked in since becom­
ing 4-H members. 53 record 
books were turned in by the 
Cooke County 4-Hers of which 
23 went on to district. From 
the District Competition Kim, 
Sandy, and Nancy were then 
chosen to go to state.

Antonetti Horses 
Win in Arkansas

Dr. and Mrs. Alfredo Anton­
etti had top winners in the 
horse show at the State Fair 
of Arkansas.

“Top Doc B arrett,” a 1972 
stallion, won first in its divi­
sion, went on to become the 
reserve junior grand champion 
and was first as the most color­
ful Appaloosa.

“Miss Top Prize,” a 1972 Ap­
paloosa filly, was the reserve 
junior grand champion after 
being first in its class.

They w ere shown by John 
McPike of Keller, Texas, 
trainer of the Antonetti horses.

Mrs. H. S. Wilde of Gaines­
ville spent three days last 
week with the Herb McDaniels 
and also visited other rela­
tives, Mrs. Richard Wilde and 
Mrs. Joe Wilde. Earlier visi­
tors with the McDaniels were 
her niece Mrs. Joe Kastner of 
Denver, Colo., and her daugh­
ter Mrs. Bob DeJongh and 
three children of Dallas where 
she had been visiting and help­
ing the DeJong family pack 
for a move to California.

o l t '

A double knit

CUFFED
FLARES

Patterns ^ So lid s

*19.00
i nHAMRICS

*7i4e P la ca  la  ya  {p+

B ic u t c U . <U4 K n o w

P R E M 1 E R E D / W S

dependable Zenith quality!

Brillian t n e w
Chromacolor
picture!

100%
solid-state
chassis

•
30,000 volts* of 
picture power!
*  de sign  average

The ALTAIR 
E4S47M
Early American
lowboy
console.
Chromatic 
One-button 
Tuning. Power 
Sentry System. 
AFC.

$589.95

Muenster Butane Company
PauL James and Clyde Walterscheid
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Beverly Walterscheid Is Crowned 
Queen in SH Homecoming Ceremony

A large crowd of Sacred 
H eart High football f a n s  
cheered the Tigers to victory 
i n their homecoming game 
Saturday night with Callisburg 
W ildcats and cheered s o m e  
more when Miss Beverly W al­
terscheid was crowned home­
coming queen.

After the game a jubilant 
groud of ex-students gathered 
in the Parish Hall for a social 
hour with refreshm ents and a 
program  honoring graduates 
of 1943, 1953 and 1963, while 
teens got together for a dance 
in the school gym.

Formalities of the queen’s 
coronation at half-tim e began 
w ith a march of princesses and 
queen nominees to mid-field 
w here they and their Tiger es­
corts were introduced, and 
ended w ith the long-awaited 
announcem ent of the queen 
whose identity had been kept 
secret.

Leading the march w a s  
freshm an princess Sally En- 
dres escorted by Craig Sang- 
ster and followed by sopho­
more princess Dianne Kralicke 
escorted by Mark Hess, junior 
princess Laura Kralicke es­
corted by Chris Sicking, queen 
candidates Peggy Hoedebeck 
escorted by Steve Taylor, Dor­
een Pels escorted by Dickie 
Moster, Beverly W alterscheid 
escorted by Kevin Pels and 
Lanie Yosten escorted by John 
Bartush.

O ther participants included 
Miss Nancy Fuhrmann, last 
year’s queen who relinquished 
her crown by handing it to 
Kevin Pels for the honors. Miss 
Yvonne Gehrig, 1971 queen 
who presented a bouquet of 
red roses and Denise W alter­
scheid, 1970 queen who pre­
sented the Tiger queen banner.

Mrs. Norbert W alterscheid 
was a t the microphone. The 
girls were in formals.

Sacred Heart Alumni Asso­
ciation sponsored the social 
and program during which 
Sylvan W alterscheid was mas­
ter of ceremonies.

Introduction o f honored 
graduates was made by class­
mates: Harold Luke of Arling­
ton, class of ’43; Dan Haver-

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC

301 E. Broadway 
665-3521, Gainesville 

If no answer call 
665-2452

Dorothy’s 
Fashionette 

Beauty Salon
Open Tuesday 
thru Saturday

SHARRON KNABE 
VICKIE KUHN 

DOROTHY MITCHELL

665 - 9402
303 S. Chestnut 

Gainesville
"Beauty is not a Gift, 

It's a  Habit."

kamp, class of ’53; and Mrs. 
Gilbert Boydstun and Mrs. 
Paul Dangelmayr, class of ’63. 
Each of the honored graduates 
brought the assemblage up to 
date on his or her occupation, 
spouse, children, and w here­
abouts since graduation.

Father Placidus Eckart, Sis­
ter Carmelita, Sister Mary 
John and Sister Theresina of 
SH faculty spoke briefly, the 
latter after having received a 
standing ovation. Most of the 
honored graduates are her 
“grandchildren.” She taught 
their parents.

Before the program, those a t­
tending h e l p e d  themselves 
from a buffet of pick-up foods.

Q u e e n  Beverly, blonde 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ju l­
ian W alterscheid, is a senior 
as all contenders for the title 
are.

Throughout her high school 
years she has been active in 
school-connected and ex tra­
curricular activities. As a sen­
ior she is drill team  captain, 
fiscal chairman of the CYO, 
president of her 4-H club, vice 
president of the student coun­
cil and honor society, co-edi­
tor of Mosaics, and member 
of the annual staff. *

Baby Felderhoff 
Baptized Sunday

August Henry Felderhoff, 
infant son of Mr. and Mrs. 
August (Gussie) Felderhoff, 
was christened Sunday m orn­
ing in Sacred Heart Church 
with a grand-uncle Bishop A. 
Danglmayr officiating at the 
8:30 ceremony.

Attending as sponsors were 
Miss Nancy Schedel of Dallas 
and Jerry  Fleitman. Others 
present were the parents, 
grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Droll of Pecos and Mr. 
and Mrs. H ubert Felderhoff, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Bruno Fleit­
man.

Breakfast for the group was 
held afterward, prepared by 
Mrs. Ed K nauf for her nep­
hew’s christening day in the 
Hubert Felderhoff home.

B I R T H S

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Fisher 
are parents of a daughter born 
Tuesday, Oct. 16, 12:25 p.m. at 
Muenster Hospital. The eight 
pound ten ounce girl * joins a 
family of five other girls and 
four boys. She’s a granddaugh­
ter for Mr. and Mrs. Rudolph 
Grill of Eureka Springs, Ark., 
and Mr. and Mrs. John Fisher.

Mr. and Mrs. Damian Mos­
ter proudly announce their 
first child, a daughter Chera- 
mie Beth, five pounds 15 
ounces, born at M uenster Hos­
pital Thursday, Oct. 11, 2:55 
p.m. She’s a granddaughter for 
Mrs. Johnny Moster of Muen­
ster and Bill Cole of Utah and 
a great-granddaughter for Mrs. 
Ed Moster of Lindsay.

Proud first-tim e parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Andy Klem ent an­
nounce the birth  of their 
daughter, f i v e  pounds 11 
ounces, Monday, Oct. 15, 11:48 
a.m. at M uenster Hospital. 
She’s welcomed also by grand­
parents Mr. and Mrs. Ed Con- 
rady of W indthorst and Mr. 
and Mrs. Gene Klement.

I

I S

ELECTRIC AND FIRE SAFETY were demonstrated 
at a 4-H adult and junior leaders conference with Tulu 
Hickerson, center, giving the program. She is showing 
Bernice Thurman, County Extension agent, a coffee can 
covered with a fire label and filled with common baking 
soda — a kitchen fire bucket. At left is Ava Knapp, new 
assistant County Extension agent.

4-H Leaders Learn 
Electric and Fire 
Safety at Program

Adult and Junior 4-H Lead­
ers met Monday, October 15 at 
Cooke County Electric Cooper­
ative’s office. There were 32 
adult and junior representa­
tives from Muenster, Era, Lind­
say, Valley View, Callisburg, 
Gainesville and Sivells Bend.

Bernice Thurman, County 
Extension agent introduced 
the new Assistant County Ex­
tension Agent Ava Knapp who 
then presided over the m eet­
ing. The speaker was Tulu 
Hickerson, Home Service Ad­
visor for Cooke County Elec­
tric Cooperative who presented 
a program on electric and fire 
safety.

Coffee cans and labels were 
used as visual aids in the fire 
p r e v e n t i o n  demonstration. 
These fire buckets were then 
filled with common baking 
soda which is one of the best 
chemicals to combat fires. She 
also reviewed some of the safe­
ty Trints which should be ob­
served in the home. Some of 
these rem inders she noted 
were (1) never turn on an ap­
pliance switch when standing 
on a wet floor, (2) don’t touch 
plumbing or metal object and 
an appliance at the same time, 
(3) follow the m anufacturer’s 
instructions for operation and 
care, (4) teach children not to 
touch appliances with wet 
hands, (5) use heat resistant 
cords, (6) tu rn  off any appli­
ance that sparks or stalls, (7) 
always disconnect small appli­
ances before cleaning, (8) con­
nect appliance directly to wall- 
outlet (not to extension cord), 
(9) keep combustible m aterials 
(clothing, curtains, p a p e r s )  
away from lamps or heating 
devices, (10) be sure iron is un­
plugged when you leave it, 
and (11) never leave Christ­
mas tree lights on when you 
leave home. Labels and book­
lets w e r e  also furnished by 
Mrs. Hickerson for each of the 
leaders.

The meeting was concluded 
after Miss Knapp passed out 
packets for upcoming activi­
ties.

Mrs. Jerry  W alker of Ken­
drick, Okla., was a visitor sev­
eral days with her sisters Mrs. 
Carl W alterscheid and Mrs. 
Pat Hess and made daily trips 
to see their father Tom Ham il­
ton at Arlington Memorial 
Hospital.

Rain Transfers 
MHS Homecoming 
Queen Crowning

Ex students of M uenster 
High got no cooperation from 
the w eather for their home­
coming last Friday night, but 
they made the most of a bad 
situation. Their queen crown­
ing ceremony, scheduled for 
half time at the football game, 
was rained out and postponed 
until the dance afterw ard in 
the KC hall.

Shirley Swirczynski, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Swjrczynski was revealed as 
the 1973 queen and crowned 
by Miss Marlene Herr, last 
year’s queen with all the pomp 
and formality planned for the 
grandstand show. The attend­
ance of former students and 
parents was especially grati­
fying.

Mrs. Bill Moon and 
Kin Visit in Tenn.

MARYSVILLE — Mrs. Bill 
Moon has returned from a trip  
to Shiloh, Tenn., traveling 
with her sister and brother- 
in-law the Raymond Orsburns 
of Bell Gardens, Calif., who 
were guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Moon for a week.

Shiloh is the hometown of 
the sisters’ father, the late J. 
L. Barlow, who was born there 
two years after the Battle of 
Shiloh. The site is now a na­
tional m ilitary park, including 
cemetery and battlefield which 
they visited and looked up 
cousins. T h e i r  grandfather 
fought in the Civil War.

While at Marysville the 
Californians visited also with 
her other sister Mrs. Mary 
Gregory at Gainesville and a 
niece and family the Max H ar­
rells there. The Orsburns re ­
turned to California Tuesday.

Young Matron Is 
Shower Honoree

A gift shower honored Mrs. 
Mike Frost Sunday afternoon 
in Carol’s Beauty Salon with 
Miss Patti Sicking and Mrs. 
Daniel Schm itt as co-hostesses.

A Raggedy Ann and Rag­
gedy Andy them e was carried 
out in a pink and blue color 
scheme and the two cakes that 
were served with punch sim u­
lated the famous nursery book 
characters. The honoree opened 
and displayed gifts. About 25 
guests were present.

Dear Customer,

We are having an October Fes­
tival Sale. You can get luxurious­
ly thick 100% Nylon shag carpet­
ing in a beautiful collection of 
solids and tweeds, now for only 
$6.95 sq. yard installed with pad. 
Regularly $8.15.

Sincerely,

Modern Floors
206 N. Main 

Muenster. Texas 
759-2348

P. S. Don’t miss this money­
saving deal. Sale ends Oct. 31st.

NEWS
OF THE SICK

Tom Hamilton underwent 
major surgery Monday at A r­
lington Memorial Hospital and 
is making satisfactory recov­
ery according to members of 
his family who are daily visi­
tors while Mrs. Hamilton stays 
with her husband. He will en­
joy cards which may be ad­
dressed tp him at the hospital, 
800 West Randol Mill Road, 
Room 309, Arlington, Texas 
76012.

Mrs- Dave Berres under­
went cornea transplant surgery 
Tuesday at Mary Shiels Hos­
pital in Dallas and is “doing 
fine.” She’ll be hospitalized 
about a week.

Brhce Fuhrm ann returned 
to classes Tuesday after being 
dismissed from M uenster Hos­
pital Monday. He had under­
gone surgery to pin a collar­
bone break. The accident hap­
pened during football practice 
last Thursday and will keep 
him off the SH Tiger squad 
for the rem ainder of the sea­
son. He is a sophomore, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Val Fuhrmann.

Chris Schilling, SHH Tiger, 
won’t be in the lineup for ac­
tion the rest of the season. He 
broke his left arm at the wrist 
during football practice Wed­
nesday afternoon. He’s the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Carl Schilling^

H O SP ITA L  NOTES
The following patients were 

dismissed during the past week 
at M uenster Memorial Hos­
pital.

Tuesday, Oct. 9: Mrs. Aug­
ust Felderhoff and baby boy, 
Mrs. Anthony Knabe and baby 
girl and Arnold Hess, Muen­
ster; Cathy Clark, Sanger; 
Mrs. D o n a l d  Armstrong, 
Gainesville.

Wednesday, Oct. 10: Wilfred 
Sicking, Muenster.

Thursday, Oct. 11: Shawn 
Vogel, Mrs. Frances Kathman 
and Mrs. Claude Bayer, and 
baby girl, M uenster; Lam bert 
Beyer, Lindsay; Mrs. David 
Shotwell and baby girl and 
Mrs. Ronald M urrell and baby 
boy, Gainesville.

Friday, Oct. 12: Joe Fisher, 
M uenster; Mrs. Alvin Garner, 
W hitesboro, Kent Lyons, Saint 
Jo; Mrs. Richard Hesse and

baby girl, Mrs. John Crisp and 
baby boy, and Carla Simmons, 
Gainesville.

Saturday, Oct. 13: John 
Fisher, M uenster; J. E. Sim­
mons. M arietta, Okla., Phil 
Wood, Gainesville.

Sunday, Oct. 14: Mrs. Dam­
ien Moster and baby girl, 
M uenster; Mrs. Clarence Loh- 
bauer, Gainesville.

Monday, Oct. 15: Ed Hess, 
Christine Fleitman, Norbert 
Knabe and Bruce Fuhrm ann, 
M uenster; Mack J. Kirk, For- 
estburg.

Tuesday, Oct. 16: Joe Fox, 
Richardson; Jennifer Murrell, 
John H. Swift and Lee Park- 
hill, Gainesville; Mrs. Cora 
Moore, Saint Jo.

MHS Band Takes 
Fruit Cake Orders

Bond members of M uenster 
Public School are busy on a 
project of selling fruit cakes to 
raise money for their band 
fund. They are taking orders 
for Manor Texas Fruitcakes to 
be delivered shortly before 
Thanksgiving. All of the mem­
bers are supplied with samples 
and all are accepting orders.

Proceeds of the project will 
go into a fund which is used 
for m aintenance of uniforms 
and equipm ent and the pur­
chase of instrum ents. Students 
are asking the public to help 
the band by using this means 
of buying fru it cakes for the 
holidays.

Birthday Dinner 
For Weldon Vogel

Weldon Vogel celebrated 
his birthday Saturday evening 
at a fried chicken dinner giv­
en by his m other Mrs. Joe 
Vogel in her home. B irthday 
gifts and a decorated cake 
were included.

Guests were the honoree’s 
wife and children Dale and 
Kari, Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred 
Walterscheid, Mrs. Leo Hess 
and children Brian and Sherri, 
A1 Vogel and Tom Vogel, all 
of Muenster, and from Dallas 
Leonard Vogel, Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Vogel and Miss Chrystel 
Monzel. Don Vogel took time 
out to attend MHS homecom­
ing.

HAMRIC’S
Men's & Boys' Wear

*1lte P la c e  to  <po
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Curlee, Jarman, Levi, 
Van Heusen, Wimbley, 

Melrose, Jockey, Campus 
Donmoor, Tom Sawyer

W elcome
to our new STUDIO

A ia th ew 3  (Photographer3
625 N. Grand, Gainesville 665-2431
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w O S I NT * SELL B U Y

< n r o u u  if i n d nr i n  t h e  w a n t  a d s  !
OUND • SERVICE • EM F>UOMM ENT • PERSONAU

CLASSIFIED AD RATES 
F irst in sertion  6 cents per word. 

M inim um  $1.00
Follow ing insertion  4 cen ts per 
w ord. M inim um  50 cents.

DISPLAY CLASSIFIED
F irst In sertion  .....  per col in. $1.50
S tanding  A d ___ per col. in. $1.00

DISPLAY IN BORDER 
F irs t in sertion  per col. in. $1.75 
S tand ing  a d ____ per col in . $1.25

C ard of T hanks $1.25
LEGAL NOTICE RATES 

F irs t in sertion  2 cen ts per word. 
Follow ing in sertion  1 cen t per word.

FOR SALE
FOR SALE: 1968 Delmont 

Olds power & Air, good condi­
tion. Phone Saint Jo before 5 
p.m. 995-2424; after 5, 995-2461.

48-tf
FOR SALE: Used Couch & 

Chair, 759-2704. 48-1

FOR SALE: Antique piano 
at K of C Hall. See or call 
A1 Fleitman after 4 p.m. 48-2

FOR SALE
"MEDDERS STORY"

How to Borrow
$3 Million 

with no collateral
Speedy's Arco

Phone 4515
FOR SALE: 1974 2-bedroom, 

IV2 baths Mobile Home. Never 
lived in. Take over payments, 
$89 a month. Call collect 817- 
464-7721. . 47-4

NORA SEED OATS for 
sale.. F irst and second year 
from registered seed. Raised 
on clean sudan land. 759-4389.

Apache 
Steel Gates

Stocked in lengths of '4-ft. 
8-ft., 10-ft., 12-£t-

Wil-O-Mac
Gainesville

48-tf

1974 4-bedroom, 2 baths Mo­
bile Home for sale. Never 
lived in. Take over payments, 
$118 a month. Call collect 817- 
464-7721. 47-4

FINE DIAMONDS 
WATCHES, JEWELRY 

WATCH REPAIR

KOESLER JEWELRY 
M uenster

Woolfolk Nursery
Complete Landscaping Ser­

vice. Shrubs, garden chemicals, 
plants, bird baths, statuary, 
fall bulbs.

E. Hwy. 82, Gainesville
46-tf

Auction
Estate of

Ricardo De Blanco
Sat., Oct. 27 

11 a.m.
Take Highway 373 north 

from Muenster, Texas, at Main 
St. Go approxim ately 10 miles 
and tu rn  right at auction sign 
approxim ately 1 mile +0 big 
yellow stone house on right.

Selling all furnishings of 
ranch house.

4 beautiful oriental rugs, 
French living room suite, 
French currio cabinets,
3 hand-carved camper chests, 
Carved chairs,
French chairs,
Almost new sectional sofa, 
Gold fram e mirrors, 
Porcelain pictures,
King size bedroom suite, 
Crystal lamps,
Chandelier,
Tea cart,
Dishes,
Cooking utensils,
Air compressor,
Shop tools,
Over 500 items to sell.*9

Everyone Welcome 
Bill Wade Auctioneer

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies

Structural Steel 
an d  Pipe 

Metal Sales, Inc.
On Highway 82 

west of Gainesville

1974 Travel Trailer 8x21 self 
contained for sale. Take over 
payments, $65 a month. Call 
collect 817-464-7721. 47-4

Hudgins 
Sewing Circle

309 E. Calif., 665-2542 
Gainesville

SALES and SERVICE 
on all makes of 

sewing machines and 
vacuum cleaners

For service in Muenster 
call the Fabric Center 

759-4401

Good Car Buys
3 new 73 Caprice 4 doors

Several Driver Training 
Im palas & Chevelles

73 Monte Carlo loaded
73 Buick Century 2 door 
Regal, air, power, stereo
72 Im pala 4 door clean, 

low mileage
’68 Chevrolet Bel-Air 4 

door low mileage, 
clean
Good selection of 

used pickups

Wilde Chevrolet
47-tf

Telephone poles 
for Sale

Community Lum ber Co.. 
Full Line

Arts & Crafts Supplies 
Artist's M aterials

Decorated Cakes for 
all occasions 

Carolyn's Craft Shop 
759-2767, 9 a.m.-6 p.m. 

Carolyn & Chas. Bayer 
N. Ash Street (43-tf)

ELECTRIC MOTOR
Sales & Repairs 
Oil field Wiring

Service Calls
Muenster Electric

42-tf

Stereos. Tapes 
Records 

Accessories
Every Day Low Prices 

8 track Tapes _ $2.99

Don’:
Record Rack

203 E. California 
Gainesville, 865-9174

Call
Dan Luke 
759-2522

FOR
BUTANE 

PROPANE 
FINA GAS 
FINA OIL

Close Out Prices 
on

LAWNMOWERS
RIDING & PUSH 

MOWERS

Community 
Lumber Company

Muenster 43-tf

CONCRETE WORK: Any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish 
ready mix concrete. Bayer 
Concrete. 28tf

WRANGLERS
Shoes — Boots

Work - Dress - Western

Nocona Boots
Men's & Boys' Store

J. R. Hocker
207 N. Commerce, Gainesville

TANKS. Septic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks, w ater tanks. 
Will install. Bayer concrete. 
Phone 759-4244, M uenster.

WANTED
HELP WANTED

Single needle operators 
Experience preferred 

Good working conditions 
Paid holidays & vacations 

Group Insurance 
Apply at 120 N. Sycamore

JR. ELITE
Muenster, Texas

44-t.f

RED FOOT for tired, aching, 
perspiring feet, a th lete’s foot. 
Kills odor. Red Foot foot pow­
der. Nick M iller’s Shoe Re­
pair Shop. 26-tf

CERAMIC TILE. New and 
old installation. For estimate 
call Ted Henscheid, 759-4280, 
Muenster. 5tf

Buy your
ELECTRIC
MOTORS

W here they can be 
Serviced.

All sizes sold 
and  repaired.

Motors for 
Water Wells & 
Air-conditioners

Oil Field Wiring 
Service Calls

UNITED
ELECTRIC SERVICE

CHRIS MULLER 
East Hy. 82, Muenster 

817-759-4517
21-tf

MOTORS, all sizes, for milk­
ing machines, w ater pumps, 
oil field equipment, etc. C. D. 
Sham burger Lum ber Co. 43tf

SHAG
100% Nylon 

Completely Installed

$7.50 sq. yd.
Specials on 
Roll Ends

Indoor-Outdoor
Carpet

Linoleum. 
Vinyl. Tile

Dale's
Carpet Shop
Dale & Pat M artin 

and Don Bezner 
665-2208, Gainesville

WANTED:
Rod Machine Operator
Must be experienced 

Also helpers
No experience necessary 

Grewing Brothers 26-tf

SERVICE
GLASS: Plate, window, auto­

mobile, furn iture tops, mirrors.
Complete glass service. We 
h a n d l e  insurance claims. 
Gainesville Glass Shop. 665- 
3321, 311 N. Chestnut. 37tf

PRE FINISHED 
P A N E L I N G

in stock at
Community Lum ber Co.

Dozer Service
Call or See

Frank Hess
759-4249

Complete Auto Serv­
ice, Spin type wheel 
balance, front end align­
ment, air conditioning 
service & tune-up at 
R&M Auto. Bob W alter- 
scheid. 24tf

ELECTRICAL 
INSTALLATIONS 

& REPAIRS
Including Heating 

and Air Conditioning 
Residential & Commercial

GRIGGS ELECTRIC
Day ph. 759-2232 

Nite ph. 768-2759
34-tf

Deep Steam 
Carpet 

Cleaning
Newland 

Furniture Co.
2005 E. Hwy. 82 

Phone 665-2461 
Gainesville

REAL ESTATE
HOUSE FOR SALE

Three bedrooms & den or 
four bedrooms, 1 complete two 
Vi baths, Central Heat & Air, 
fenced yard, carpeted, all elec­
tric. 208 N. Hickory, call 759- 
2913. 41-tf

Real Estate Broker
Bonded real estate broker 

qualified to act as agent for 
sales or rentals.
759-2257, M uenster State Bank 

Henry G. W einzapfel 
759-4161, 630 W einzapfel St. O

FOR RENT

For Home Delivery of 
Fort W orth S tar Telegram 
or Dallas M orning News 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828, Bx. 546, Sanger 16tf

Water Pumps
Submersible 

Vi H.P. to 40 H.P.

Plastic Pipe
A very inexpensive 

way to get water 
where you need it.

C. D. Shamburger 
Lumber Co.

Muenster

CARPET
TILE

VINYL FLOORING 
EXPERT INSTALLATION

Modem Floors
Muenster, Texas 
Phone 759-4350 

Roy Monday, owner
14tf|

The only complete 
Supply House for all

Vacuum Cleaners
Electric Brooms 

Polishers
Parts <& Supplies

Rebuilt Vacuums 
$19.50 up

Your authorized
Singer Dealer
for Cooke County 

Sales & Service

KIRBY CO.
835 E. California 

Gainesville
29-tf

I t pays to advertise with 
the M uenster Enterprise.

Custom
Picture Framing 

and Matting

Newland 
Furniture Co.

Gain Seville 25tf

You Bend 'Em 
WE'LL 

MEND 'EM
Car rebuilding 

& painting
Windshields, Door glass

FREE ESTIMATES

AL H O R N
5th & Cedar, 759-4471 

30tf

MOBILE HOME for r e n t  2 
bedroom, fully furnished, a 
block from school on N. Wal­
nut. Ph. 759-2268, Jerom e Pa- 
gel. 16-tf

THANKS
We wish to acknowledge 

with thanks the thoughtfulness 
of all our friends and neighbors 
for the nice cards and gifts and 
their presence which made our 
50th wedding anniversary one 
of the happiest days of our 
lives.
— Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Morrison

W estinghouse 
Appliances 
&  Zenith TVs

Sales and Service

Radio & TV Repair 
Muenster Butane

Ph. 759-4411

Ann Noggler and  
Tommy Trammell 
Say W edding Vows

Miss Ann Noggler, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Alvin 
Noggler of Gainesville, and 
Tommy Joe Trammell, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Trammell, 
also of Gainesville, w ere m ar­
ried in the home of the groom’s 
parents on Sept. 28 and since 
returning from their honey­
moon are at home on Rt. 2. 
Gainesville.

Tl>e Rev. Marvin Lancaster, 
pastor of South Side Baptist 
Church, directed the exchange 
of vows in front of the fire­
place which was decorated 
with pink tapers and pink and 
orchid gladioli. *

The bride wore a formal 
white knit empire dress with 
beribboned lace accenting the 
front of the bodice and skirt. 
Lace also trimm ed the cuffs of 
the long puffed sleeves and a 
wide ruffle edged the skirt. 
She carried pink and white 
gladioli.

Mrs. Gary Don Clark, sister 
of the groom, in a pink and 
white knit dress, and David 
J. Vanhoozen, groom’s uncle, 
were wedding attendants.

Guests included the bride’s 
grandm other Mrs. Susie Nog­
gler of Muenster.

Wedding reception was held 
in the home’s dining area.

The bride attended Gaines­
ville High School. The groom 
is a graduate of Callisburg 
High and is employed at Na­
tional Supply.

N O T IC E
Effective Monday, October 29, 1973 

our store hours will be: 
Monday - Friday 7:30 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Saturdays 7:30 a.m. to 12 noon 

Also Effective Same Date:
Custom grinding & mixing will be handled by 
"APPOINTMENT ONLY" as time permits, 
Monday thru Friday, none on Saturday.

MUENSTER MILLING CO.
PHONE 759-2287

ROSS POINT COMMUNITY LEADERS, left to 
right, Ruth Christian, Tommy Richardson, president of 
Ross Point Community Club, Gerri Sangster, and Junior 
Durham, county advisory committee representative.

Muenster Juniors 
Beat Frisco 30-8 
In 14-A Opener

The 14-A junior high season 
started on a pleasant note for 
the Little Monsters Tuesday 
night as they m arked up a 30-8 
win over the Frisco young­
sters. M uenster boys had it in 
the bag in the first few minutes 
of play and got all their points 
before half time. Then Muen- 
ster’s little fellows got into the 
action and Frisco eventually 
got on the scoreboard.

The victory was expensive, 
however. Nick W alterscheid 
paid for it w ith a broken col­
lar bone and will be out for 
the rest of the season.

M uenster started moving on 
its first possession. Six plays 
went 34 yards for a touchdown 
and Gary Hermes did the scor­
ing from the 1.

On next possession Muen­
ster bogged down but an in ter­
ception by Neal W alterscheid 
put them back in business on 
the Frisco 38. Bryan Sicking 
got loose there and streaked 
to pay dirt. Hermes followed 
over for two more points.

Next time they got hold of 
the ball they were on their 
way again. Sicking went 5 to 
midfield and Nick W alter­
scheid, on an option, got to 
pay dirt. Sicking’s run upped 
it by 2 points.

And then, just three plays 
after kickoff, Darrell Zimmer- 
er intercepted and returned 
about 30 yards for the fourth 
score. Nick W alterscheid’s run 
raised the count to 30-0 mo­
ments before the half.

That was all for Muenster. 
In the second half Coach Rich­
ardson sent in his little fellows 
and Frisco took charge. Muen­
ster made just one first down, 
the Coons made four.

Just as the final quarter 
started the visiting kids started 
a 94 yard drive tha t put them 
on the board. Only 8 plays 
were needed and the scoring 
play went for 56 yards. An­
other scoring run moments la­
ter was nullified by a clip pen­
alty.

Ross Point Area 
Group Discusses 
Progress Program

Community leaders of Ross 
Point and Gene Davenport, 
Community Service M anager 
of Cooke County Electric Co­
op, m et last Thursday in the 
Ross Point community center 
to discuss a program of com­
munity progress.

They considered both long 
range and short range projects, 
and a community status su r­
vey dealing w i t h  geography 
and political subdivisions re ­
lative to the comm unity’s econ­
omy, also the importance of 
well defined goals, organiza­
tional structure and leader­
ship.

The concluding topic was on 
m e m b e r  motivation and 
symptoms which often pre­
cede a let down in community 
effort. Related to the topic 
was self appraisal of individual 
reaction to t h e  leadership 
challenge and means of m ak­
ing their efforts more effective.

Local leaders attending were 
Tommy Richardson, H o l l i s  
Berry, George Berry, Jose­
phine Berry, Ruth Christian, 
Mrs. T. M. Sangster, Junior 
Durham and Sharon Durham.

The program is sponsored 
by Cooke County Electric Co­
op throughout its service area.

Family Dining 
Friendly Service

Try our New  
Salad - Relish Bar

The CURTWOOD 
RESTAURANT

Emmett Curtis 
Gainesville, Texas

New Item
Fruit Float, orange flavor______ 45c
New Item
Fruit Float, orange flavor_______ 45c
New Item, assorted
Chun King Dinner _____ _________ 88c
Betty Crocker 13-oz.
Blue Berry Muffin M ix__________ 49c
Mop & Glo Cleaner, 32-oz.______$1.19
Lysol Spray, 14-oz._________ $1.39
Nescafe Coffee, 10-oz._________ $1.79

P R O D U C E
B ananas________________ 2-lbs. 25c
Lettuce_______________ __head 25c
Delicious Apples, 3-lb. b a g _____ 49c

M E A T S
Hamburger _____________________ lb. 85c
Slab Bacon, no rind _____........  lb. 98c
Chuck R oast___________________ lb. 89c
Pagel's Homemade Country
Smoked S a u sa g e_______________ lb. $1.09
Round Steak _______________ lb. $1.49
Sirloin S teak ............ :_______lb. $1.49
T-Bone Steak_______ lb. $1.49

P agel’s Store
Maurice Pagel, Muenster

-
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Garden Club Sees 
Demonstration by 
Mrs, Roger Taylor

A demonstration and des­
criptive talk on terrarium s and 
bowl gardens by Mrs. Roger 
Taylor was the highlight of 
M uenster G arden Club’s Oc­
tober meeting. Mrs. A rthur 
Endres was hostess in her 
home with Mrs. Joe Luke as 
co-hostess.

Mrs. John Mosman, presi­
dent, presided for business 
during which members voted 
to adopt a special environm en­
tal project including a major 
city-wide cleanup. Mrs. Leon­
ard Endres accepted chairm an­
ship.

S t a -N u
^ P R 0  C E S

An Extra Service 
at no Extra Cost

You can see and 
feel the difference. 
Homogenizes vital 

textile oil back 
into the fabric

We Give
S & H Green Stamps

Miller's Cleaners
429 N. Commerce 

Gainesville

Miss Sylvia Hofbauer, year­
book chairman, discussed com­
ing programs and Mrs. Paul 
Endres reported on the m eet­
ing she attended with the 
Gainesville Council of Garden 
Clubs.

Mrs. Steve Moster told about 
a meeting of the parish cem e­
tery commission and made a r­
rangem ents for the cemetery 
fund collection on All Saints 
Day.

Also high on coming events 
is the club’s annual benefit 
bake sale scheduled for Satu r­
day, Nov. 17.

The hostesses served a des­
sert course to 21 members and 
two guests, Mrs. Eddie Schmitt 
and Mrs. Bill Bedrick. The 
refreshm ent table held an ar­
rangem ent of orange marigolds 
and acuba leaves. D e c o r  
stressed the Halloween theme.

A door prize, plants used in 
Mrs. Taylor’s demonstration, 
was won by Mrs. Alvin Fuhr- 
man.

Next m onth’s meeting will 
be in the home of Mrs. Leon­
ard Endres w ith  Mrs. R. N. 
Fette as co-hostess. Mrs. F ran­
cis Leach. of Gainesville, a na­
tional flower show judge, will 
bring a program  on “Holiday 
Table Arrangem ents.”

Leo Henscheid

INSURANCE
Auto, Fire, Liability 

Ph. 759-2844

See the new 1974
GMC PICKUPS

Trucks for every need

Hoedebeck GMC
Muenster

70 Are Confirmed 
By Bishop Cassata 
In Sunday Rites

Seventy candidates for con­
firm ation received the sacra­
m ent from the hands of Bishop 
John Cassata during a special 
liturgy Sunday evening at the 
7 o’clock Mass.

Confirmants and their spon­
sors were in the entrance pro­
cession with a ltar boys, clergy 
and the bishop. Members of 
the class, Toni Hoedebeck, 
Wanda Schneider, Rhonda En­
dres, and Judy W alterscheid, 
participated in the liturgy by 
giving Scripture readings, Fa­
ther Placidus Eckart, pastor, 
read the Gospel and Bishop 
Cassata gave the homily.

Petitions presented were led 
by Father Placidus, general; 
and the seven gifts of the Holy 
Spirit: knowledge by Michael 
Sicking, wisdom by Phyllis 
Grewing, understanding b y 
Carla Otto, piety by Terry 
Knabe, counsel by Kim Wal­
terscheid, fortitude by Joey 
Yosten, and fear of the Lord 
by Phil Wolf.

In the offertory procession 
were Craig W alterscheid car­
rying the Christ Candle; Cur­
tis Pagel and Bert Miller, tap ­
ers; Linda Krahl, Bible; Elaine 
W alterscheid, d o v e ;  Rene 
Wilde, red rose; Beverly Tru- 
benbach and Julia Bright, tap­
ers; Karen W alterscheid, wa­
ter; Toni D ittfurth, wine; Dea 
Swirczynski, p a t e n ;  Janell 
Lutkenhaus, ciborium; P a u l  
Bartush, chalice; Mel W alter­
scheid, Mass book; Chris Hen- 
nigan and Henry Bayer, tap ­
ers.

Anthony Luke was organist, 
Ronnie Weinzapfel, Kimberly 
Klement and Mike Richardson 
were trum peters and SH Ju n ­
ior Girls Choir w ere vocalists 
with Sister Yvonne choir d i­
rector.

Visiting Dr. and Mrs. A l­
fredo Antonetti are his cousins 
Mr. and Mrs. Juan  Muniz of 
Puerto Rico. They came in 
Septem ber and plan to remain 
through October. Mrs. Muniz 
has undergone eye surgery in 
Dallas.

QB Club Meeting
Members o f the M uenster 

High Q uarterback Club will 
have their regular meeting 
Monday night at 7 in the audi­
torium.

Many folks ta lk  economy, 
but few have the will to prac­
tice it.

Going 
Business

KING SIZE
M attress & Box Spring

BY SPRING AIR

15 year guarantee
312 power wrapped coils
Engineered for comfort 
and durability
Quilted floral tick

*15995
Reg. Retail, $319.95

Twin or Full
|

Queen Size

$79.95 $139.95

Odd Box Springs, twin size
ALL MATTRESSES IN STOCK 
REDUCED FOR CLEARANCE

Newland Fuiniiure Co
2005 E, Highway 82, Gainesville

MHS Bees Blast 
Nocona Youngsters 
In 14-A Opener

M uenster High’s B team 
started its 14-A schedule on a 
pleasant note last Thursday. It 
walloped Nocona’s s e c o n d  
string by the decisive count of 
28-0.

Two factors had a definite 
bearing on the outcome. M uen­
ster had a good lead of 201-138 
in total yardag e, also the 
young Indians had a bad 
night of mistakes and tough 
luck. Nocona lost five fumbles, 
M uenster lost two and an in­
terception. Also Nocona had a 
kick blocked for a big loss of 
yardage, M uenster had one 
partly blocked for a short loss 
of yardage

Bees started  with a pair of 
first downs and had to kick on 
the third series. However No­
cona fumbled the kick and 
M uenster had great field posi­
tion on the 10. But not for long. 
The Bees fumbled on the next 
play.

Following Nocona’s kick four 
plays later the Bees started 
again from 56 yards away. 
Three p l a y s  later T i m 
Wolf w ent 44 for a TD that 
did not count, and three tries 
after tha t Mark Sicking got 
around right end for the first 
TD. M ark Mollenkopf dived 
over for 2 more points.

Sicking was the team ’s

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Hoede­
beck of Irving visited rela­
tives here Sunday after being 
at Lindsay to visit her parents, 
the A. C. Flusches.

leading rusher, however Mol­
lenkopf, Wolf and Terry Lewis 
were also consistent gainers.

The second score also came 
in the first quarter. Nocona 
kicked after three plays and 
two plays later Lewis busted 
through the middle for 11. 
Then Wolf completed a fine 
pass to Danny Endres for a 43 
yard touchdown.

Early in the second quarter 
M uenster had another set up 
after Kenny Koelzer recovered 
a fumble on the 19. On second 
play Sicking plowed 15 to the 
4 and two plays later Lewis 
w ent in  from the 4.

The Indians came back with 
an effort that gained 38 before 
bogging down and the rest of 
the period was a stand off in ­
cluding two exchanges. Serna 
recovered a fumble and No­
cona intercepted.

After intermission Nocona 
led statistically but got nothing 
on the board whereas M uen­
ster cashed in on another No­
cona fumble.

Starting the half the Bees 
had a fat opportunity from the 
13 after blocking a Nocona 
punt, but they failed to move. 
Shortly after that they had a 
second chance after a recov­
ered fumble on the 24. An off­
side penalty plus Mollenkopf’s 
7 got to the 12. Lewis w ent for 
5, a pass to Jim  Koelzer reached 
the 1 and Mollenkopf went 
over. A pass to Endres upped 
the score to 28-0.

From then on Nocona domi­
nated the game but could not 
keep going. It made two first 
downs and fumbled. Jim  Koel­
zer recovered. Later it made

two more first downs but fiz­
zled on the third series. Be­
sides the fumble there were 
three turnovers after failing

on a fourth down try. M ean­
while M uenster made no first 
downs but set the Indians back 
three times w ith punts.

Ken Murray TV
710 E. Cali!., 668-8851, Gainesville

Across from Kroger's Open 9 to 6

Curtis-CM - Mathes 
Techna-3 Color TV

4 YEARS
Parts-Labor Warranty

100% Solid State -  All Modular

CHECK
Before you Buy 

3-day home trial

Phone 759-4434

HOFB AUER’S
FOOD & LOCKER SERVICE

COURTESY
SERVICE

PRICE
QUALITY

Carton of 8

Dr. Pepper _ _ _ _ _ _ _  69c
6 pack

Old Milwaukee Beer _ _ _ 95c
Affiliated

Sugar, 5-lb. _ _ _ _ _ _  68c
Affiliated 10-oz. twin bag

Potato Chips _
All Menus

Hamburger Helper _ _
Shurfine 22-oz.

Sweet Pickles _ _ _
20-oz. can

Ranch Style Beans _
Shurfine No. 303 can

Cut Green Beans _ _
Food King 12-oz

Catsup _ _ _ _ _
Soflin, 60-ct.

Luncheon Napkins _
Libby's No. 303 can

Corn, c.s. or w.k. _ _
Pillsbury 9.5 oz.

Cinnamon Rolls _ _
Shurfresh 8-oz.

Crescent Dinner Rolls

_ _ 39c 

_ _ 49c 

. _ _ 59c 

_ 3 - $1.00 

_4-$1.00 

_ 5-$1.00

_ _ _ 10c 

_ 5-$1.00 

_ 3-$1.00 

_ 3 - $1.00

49c
Reg. 59c bag

Candy
Reg. $1.13, 7-oz.

Crest Toothpaste _ _ _ _ 89c
Reg. 79c

Aqua Net Hair Spray _ _ _ 68c
Reg. 69c, 4-oz.

Pepto Bismol _ _ _ _ _ _  49c

A PHOTOGRAPHER
For All Ages

Will be here Tues., Oct. 23

Double Stamps 
on Wednesday
With grocery purchase 

of $5.00 or more (no 
cigarettes) on Wednesday 
we give twice as many 

S&H Green Stamps

Meats
Round Steak _ _ _ _ lb. $1.49 

Chuck Roast _ _ _ _ _ lb. 85c 

Seven Roast _ _ _ _ _ lb. 89c 

Arm Roast _ _ _ _ _  lb. 93c 

Beef Short Ribs _ _ _ _ lb. 59c 

Stew Meat, boneless _ _ lb. $1.29 

Fresh Pork Backbone 

Pork Steak _ _ _ _ _  lb. 89c 

Pork Roast _ _ _ _ _  lb. 83c

F rozen
Birds Eye, 4.5-oz.

Cool Whip _ _ _ _ _ 3-$1.00
Mrs. Paul's 9-oz.

Fish Sticks _ _ _ _ _ _ _  60c
Ida Treat 2-lb.

French Fry Potatoes _ _ _ 45c

Produce
No. 1 Russet

Potatoes _ _ _____ 10-lb. 89c

_ 1 _ _ bag 10c 

. _ _ bunch 10c

Radishes _ _

Green Onions .

Lettuce _ _ _ _ _  .head25c 

Tomatoes _ _ _ _ _ _ lb. 29c
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There’s nothing right about 

America that the  anti-A m eri­
cans aren’t doing their darnd- 
est to change.

Politics is the art of making 
yourself popular with people 
by giving them  grants of their 
own money.

Jack Cheaney’s
Western Wear

211 W. Elm, Gainesville

New Fall Coats
Good selection. Jr. & Miss sizes

JUST ARRIVED 
"Rag Doll" Junior Dresses

For the “Classic Look” . . .
Bulky Sweaters, C ardigan 
Sweaters, Vest Sweaters

Coordinate these with our separates 
of Le Roy Knits and Campus Casuals

New shipment of new fall jewelry

PANTS by Hill Billy, Lady Wrangler 
and Gotcha Covered.

FALL BAGS in cloth and conventional

Watch for our new location soon 
109 S. Commerce, On the Square

The Band Box
111 N. Commerce, Gainesville

Hillcrest Manor 
News

O. D. Garland was back for 
the weekend, driving in from 
Lubbock. He had good news 
on his wife’s eye surgery. She 
was dismissed from the hos­
pital to continue recovery in 
the home of their son and 
daughter-in-law, Dr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd Garland at Lubbock. 
She will probably be back on 
duty at Hillcrest this weekend.

Mrs. Bob (Arlene) Tuggle 
was back to visit Thursday 
with her aunt Mrs. Nora 
Thompson and others. A form ­
er aide, she is now employed 
at the local milk plant.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill M artin of 
Lindsay were Sunday evening 
visitors with his parents.

M uenster Home Demonstra­
tion Club has helped the A ux­
iliary with a cash donation of 
$6.50 for bingo prizes, donated

In All 
The World
No on© is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you.

G E O .  J .

Carroll
&. S O N

ANOTHER NEW  SERVICE from Texas’ Oldest Savings & Loan....

F R E E
G R E E N
S T A M P S

Since October 1, Hesperian Savings has given free S & H Green 
Stamps for saving . . . instead of spending. And Hesperian still 
pays the highest interest rates available on any one of 5 regu­
lated savings or investment accounts. (Even higher rates avail­
able on our 4-year certificates of deposit, $25,000 minimum).

To get your free S & H Green 
Stamps, just open a new ac­
count or add to your present 
account in these amounts:

4,500 stamps for $5,000 or more 
2,200 stamps for $3,000 to $4,999 
2,100 stamps for 1,000 to 2,999

All accounts are insured to 
$20,000 by the Federal Sav­
ings & Loan Insurance Corpor­
ation. Deposits in by the 10th 
of any month, earn from the 
1st.

1,500 stamps for 500 to 999
1,200 stamps for 250 to 499

600 stamps for 150 to 249

5-14% 5.14%
Passbook Account 6-mo. cert (mm. $1 ,000)

6-34%
12-mo. cert. (mm. J1 000) 30-mo. cerl. (mm. $5,000)

7*%
48-mo. carl. (min. |1 0.000)

CONVENIENT SAVE-BY-MAIL SERVICE

To open a new account, come in, call or write for a convenient form. 
To add to your present account,* just send your check together with 
your passbook or certificate. To transfer your account to Hesperian 
Savings, come in, call or write for easy instructions. In all cases, 
your passbook or certificate, plus your free S & H Green Stamps 
will be returned to you the same day we receive your request. If 
you’d like answers to any questions first, just call us (collect) at 
AC 817-665-3486.

*  Regulations allow I gift pet person per year tor new accounts D'tfing the first 3 weeks of this month. 
} g'ti per person for additions Maximum of 1 gift per person this month

“MORE 
OF WHAT 

YOU’ RE LOOKING FOR”

HESPERIAN
SAVINGS

101 E. Broadway, Gainesville, Texas 76204
Phone: (817) 665-3486

by HDC members individually.

Mrs. Willie Fuhrm ann, the 
Billy Fuhrm anns and family 
and the Joe Paul Fuhrmanns, 
all of Lindsay, visited Willie 
Fuhrm ann Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Luke of 
Dallas w ere among visitors 
with her mother Mrs. C. J 
Wimmer, last Sunday.

Mrs. Dorothy McLendon of 
Rosamon, Calif., visited a t the 
home one day. She’s the mo­
ther of staffer Virginia Blass- 
ingame and is visiting Virginia 
and her husband Burt in Saint 
Jo.

Mrs. Ena Mitchell is back, 
dismissed from M uenster Hos­
pital, where she had under­
gone surgery to pin her bro­
ken left hip. She’s able to 
spend part time in a wheel­
chair.

Chaplain Father Placidus 
Eckart who has long visited at 
the home to cheer and bless on 
Friday afternoon continues his 
visits.

Hillcrest Auxiliary h a s  
added another member, Mrs. 
Joe Hess, who was with the 
group last Wednesday to 
spread their usual cheer and 
conduct the weekly bingo par­
ty with prizes. With her were 
Mrs. T. Voth, Mrs. Arlin Naeg- 
eli and Mrs. Leonard Endres. 
Mrs. Voth served cookies and 
lemonade.

The Rev. Clarence Russell, 
pastor of Assembly of God 
Church of Saint Jo, conducted 
Sunday afternoon services at 
the home. jHis group of music­
ians entertained with vocal 
a n d  instrum ental numbers. 
Mike Hogan is guitarist. His 
mother Mrs. Jack Hogan, 
home staffer, was one of the 
piano players.

The home lost Mrs. Dollie 
Thomas, 75, who failed to su r­
vive pneumonia and compli­
cations. The end came Oct. 
6 at M uenster Hospital. F in­
al rites were held Monday at 
2 p.m. in Terral, Okla. A 
daughter Mrs. Viola Miller of

ISSI]F
FRIGIDAIRE

Frigidaire
Sales & Service

Personality 
Furniture House 

Inc.
2003 E. Highway 82 

668-8833 
Gainesville

Saint Jo and two grandchil­
dren survive.

Mrs. Jack Hogan had a few 
m inutes away from the k it­
chen Monday when a nephew 
Bruce Orr of Dallas stopped 
by to chat. He and his family 
were enroute to Saint Jo to 
visit her parents, the C. L. 
Wilsons.

M a r y  M argaret Rohmer, 
singing to her guitar accom­
paniment, is a frequent visi­
tor w ith her grandm other Mrs. 
Mary E. Felderhoff a n d  
spreads h e r  entertainm ent 
around to others in their 
rooms. Some afternoons she 
is joined by Mary and Di- 
ann Caplinger in making music 
and singing.

Mrs. Minnie Kinman was in 
Fort Worth last week visiting 
a daughter and son-in-law who 
came for her and brought her 
back.

Msgr. Brady Back 
At St. Mary's for 
50th Anniversary

Msgr. John P. Brady, former 
pastor of St. M ary’s in Gaines­
ville, returned  there Oct. 7 
to celebrate Mass in observ­
ance of his golden jubilee as a 
priest.

St. M ary’s was his first parish 
assignment following his or­
dination in 1923. He spent 25 
years as pastor before being 
assigned t o St. Edw ard’s 
Church in Dallas where he is 
in his 25th year as pastor. He 
was raised to a Domestic P re­
late by Pope Pius XII in 1953.

St. M ary’s parishioners in­
vited him to return  to Gaines­
ville to offer a Mass of 
Thanksgiving and honored him 
at a dinner in the KC Hall af­
ter the 5 p.m. service. Rev. 
Patrick J. Lynch of Irving de­
livered the homily. The Rev. 
James Gillespie, pastor of St. 
M ary’s, was present in the 
sanctuary.

Among those attending were 
Mr. and Mrs. Urban Endres 
and Mr. and Mrs. Steve Mos- 
ter and sons Frank and Chris 
of Muenster.

Mrs. Moster had joined Mrs. 
M argaret Sicking, Tony and 
M i s s  Theresa Sicking of 
Gainesville and Mrs. Lena 
Zimmerer of Lindsay in a t­
tending the formal jubilee 
celebration in Dallas the prev­
ious Sunday.

A native of County Long­
ford, Ireland, Msgr. Brady re ­
ceived his seminary training 
in Ireland and at St. Patrick’s 
Seminary, Menlo Park, Calif., 
and Kenrick Seminary in St. 
Louis, Mo. In addition to his 
pastoral duties at St. Edw ard’s 
he serves as Catholic chaplain 
a t Baylor Hospital.

“I need a holiday,” said the 
pretty  cashier. “I’m not look­
ing my best.”

“Nonsense,” said the m an­
ager.

“It isn’t nonsense, the men 
are beginning to count their 
change.”

He who drinks before he 
drives puts the quart before 
the hearse.

A cynic is a man who knows 
the price of everything and 
the value of nothing.

PEG-BOARD
Hard working, good-looking, Peg- 
Board by Masonite Corp., adds 
utility to walls everywhere, turns 
waste space into working space. 
Because it is hardboard, it won’t 
slit, splinter or crack . . . can be 
worked with ordinary carpenter 
tools and goes up quickly and 
easily. Finishes beautifully. Avail­
able in W  thickness for house­
hold use, Va" for heavy duty use.

Community 
Lumber Company

Cooke County Implement Co
Sales & Service

W. Hwy. 82 
Gainesville

C h r i s t m a s  C a t a l o g s  are He r e

$5.00 Discount on 
$50.00 and up orders

From Our Christmas Catalog 
Call today to place your order

Satisfaction Guaranteed or Your Money Back

CHOP AT SEARS 
AND SAVE Sears 315 E. California 

Gainesville
SEARS, ROEBUCK AND CO.

WATTS is the place to buy

ELECTRIC SHAVERS
Schick Norelco 

Remington
* Best Prices in Town
* Newest Models in all Lines

WATTS BROS.
Gainesville

S IG N  O F  T H E  T I M E S

The inflated dollar: you see its effect on your food prices, your 
housing prices and most other things ... just as Texas Power & 
Light sees it on the cost of everything necessary to produce and 
supply your electricity.

FUEL COSTS MORE
To produce electric power, TP&L generating plants must use 
fuel—and fuel costs more today than ever before. Since 1952, 
the price of natural gas, the principal fuel used by TP&L, has 
risen more than 500%. The Company’s 1972 fuel bill was more 
than $40 million, 30% higher than in 1971. These trends have 
continued during 1973.

CONSTRUCTION COSTS MORE
To counter uncertain supplies and rising costs of natural gas 
and fuel oil, TP&L must build new generating plants which will 
use more readily available fuels such as lignite and nuclear 
materials. Ironically, these plants cost far more to build than gas 
or oil-fueled plants. A lignite-fueled plant costs more than twice 
as much per kilowatt as a gas-fueled plant and the cost of a 
nuclear plant is still higher.

FINANCING COSTS MORE
Just as most people borrow money to build their homes, TP&L 
borrows money to construct its power plants and other facilities. 
The interest rates the Company must pay on borrowed money 
are much higher than a few years ago, adding further to the 
costs of providing electric service.
You and all TP&L customers expect an adequate and reliable 
supply of electric power and we re constantly working to meet 
this responsibility. However, because ot the squeeze of rising 
costs, it is inevitable that electric rates must De increased in the 
future.
Although your cost of electric service will be greater in the years 
ahead, electricity will still be one of the biggest bargains in your 
budget

T E X A S  P O W F .R  &  U G I  I T  C O M P A N Y
A tax-paying, investor-owned electric utility

: v
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H A L L M A R K  
Christmas Greeting Cards

Now on Display 
. . .  and gift wrapping paper

Dustin's Office Supply
110 N. Dixon, Gainesville

Tractors
Equipment
parts & service

We've Come Your Way
open in our new location

West Hwy. 82

Proffer Ford Tractor Co.
Phone 665-0361 Gainesville

Your Auto Loan
ALL WRAPPED UP AND 

READY TO GO
Time for a new car or pickup?
Let us help you finance it  Let our bank auto 
loan help you to enjoy your car while you pay.

Muenster 

State Bank
Serving the financial needs of this a rea  since 1923

Patio Party Has 
Large Attendance

A patio party  hosted by Mr. 
and Mrs. Dickie Cain of Den­
ton, Mr. and Mrs. Wendell 
Richey of Gainesville and Mr. 
and Mrs. Chris Cain of M uen­
ster at the Cain family home 
in Muenster, had as guests for 
dinner and dancing a large 
num ber of area cattle buyers, 
auctioneers, ranchers, and their 
wives, local friends and rela­
tives. The Cherry Rhone O r­
chestra provided the rhythm .

Out of town guests included 
form er M uensterites Mr. and 
Mrs. George Petrus of Denison 
and their guests, Mr. and Mrs. 
Butch Campbell, Mr. and Mrs. 
Cecil Ward of Gainesville, Mr. 
and Mrs. W. E. Hudspeth of 
Pilot Point and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill McCollum of Dallas.

The party  also was a b irth ­
day honor for Wayne Trachta 
of New Braunfels who, unfor­
tunately, was prevented from 
attending due to a business 
schedule. His wife Debbie and 
daughter De Ann stood in for 
him.

Mrs. Dick Cain and grand­
daughter Melanie Richey of 
Gainesville had flown Braniff 
from Dallas to New Braunfels 
a week earlier to visit the 
Trachtas there and Mrs. Trach­
ta and daughter flew back 
with them  to spend tim e with 
the Richard Trachtas and 
other relatives.

St. Anne Society 
Holds Reception 
For New Members

St. Anne’s Society, Sacred 
H eart Parish, held formal re ­
ception services for two new 
members Oct. 7 after the  7 
p.m. Mass. Joining a t that 
tim e were Mrs. Peter McCoy 
and Miss Hilda Pautler.

Following t h e  ceremony, 
members held their October 
meeting in SH Library with 
Mrs. AI Hess presiding.

Father Stephen Eckart, spir­
itual director, led the opening 
prayer and addressed the 
group. Mrs. Leo Henscheid 
read a serm onette on modesty 
and decency in dress.

Thirty-tw o members were 
present and there was one 
guest Mrs. Leonard Gudd, rela­
tive of Mrs. Ronnie Hoagland, 
a visitor from New Jersey. 
Mrs. Harold Knabe won the 
door prize. After adjournm ent 
the women joined members of 
St. Joseph’s Society in the 
club room for games and re ­
freshments.

Nelda Bayer in 
Italy for Study

Miss Nelda Bayer, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. M artin Bayer, 
has arrived in Bergamo, Italy, 
for a school term  of study as the 
Montessori Training Center.

She will be studying the 
Montessori approach to teach­
ing for ages 6-12. This is 
equivalent to M aster’s work in 
education.

Miss Bayer has had four 
years of experience in this ap­
proach with pre-schoolers at 
Montessori Academy in Dal­
las. To date there are eight of 
these schools in  the Dallas 
area.

For friends wishing tp keep 
in touch the address is Nelda 
Bayer, 42 T. Tasso, 24100 Ber­
gamo, Italy.

If absence makes the heart 
grow fonder, many people love 
their church.

CUSTOMER CARE
m u ... EVERYWHERE

L 1 •IJfff.V.M.lLBJm *349.00
O TTS FU RN ITU RE

jet-fast oven 
cleaning

Clean your oven the 
jet-age way. It takes just 

30 seconds to set the 
controls then the self-clean 
oven automatically cleans 
itself completely.

• 3-in-1 surface unit
• Oven timing clock
• Infinite-heat surface unit controls
• Easy-to-clean glass backsplash
• Fluorescent cooktop lamp
• Plug-in surface units

104 W. Main, Gainesville

Whitesboro Sets 
Oct. 25 & 26 for 
Peanut Festival

The W hitesboro Chamber of 
Commerce announced t h i s  
week that extensive prepara­
tions are under way for the 
annual peanut festival to be 
held Thursday and Friday, Oc­
tober 25 and 26.

Special feature for the occa­
sion is the West Grayson beau­
ty pageant at which the pres­
ent Miss Texas, Judy  M allett 
of Haltom City, will be mis­
tress of ceremonies.

O ther activities include ex­
hibits of produce, sewing, 
needlework, flower arrange­
ments, leatherw ork, etc., in the 
school gymnasium; an art show 
of paintings, sketches, charcoal 
drawings, sculpture, et-c., in 
the Security National Bank 
lobby; a pet and bicycle par­
ade for the kiddies on the First 
Baptist church lawn; and a 42 
and domino tournam ent in the 
school gym.

‘‘W hat happened to that 
dopey blonde your husband 
used to run  around with?”

‘‘I dyed my hair.”

SHUGART COUPON nan
Hofbauer's Food & Locker

405 E. Division, Hwy 82 
TUESDAY, OCTOBER 23, 1973
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W A L L E T  S IZ E  

C O L O R  P O R TR A IT S

t  IFIBSB 5 Extra charge 
\ 8  X 10/ for

GROUPS

s *a £?**ASKAfentOur
994

M & S
DAIRY & FARM CENTER
Purina Chows Yield King Seed 

De Lava Clay Perfection 
Butler Bins and  Buildings

Farm Automation Specialist
1529 N. Dixon, Gainesville

Phone: Gainesville 668-7861 Muenster 759-2598

WE’RE GOING
To CHANGE 
YOUR MIND 
ABOUT 
PERMANENT 
WAVING

Because now we have UniPerm. It's the new 
professional w ay to have beautiful perm 
results every time. It's pre-programmed to 
give you the best perm benefits, 
without perm problems.
UniPerm gives great curL automatically. And 
great condition, automatically. And because 
it's so mild, it gives the most 
natural results ever.

. Come in and change your mind. Let 
your hair experience . . .

HELENE
CURTIS

UniPerm
PRECISION PERMING SYSTEM
Make an appointment today for perfect 

beauty — naturally, automatically

Shampoo, perm, and styling $20.00 & up

Angie's Beauty Shop
759-2727

Evelyn's Styleroom

(O n ly  D o d g e  h a s  it.)

Dodge, the pickup truck innovator, has led the way with things such as Electronic Ignition 
and, most recently, the exclusive Club Cab. Our Club Cab pickup gives you 34 cubic feet 
of extra storage space inside the cab, behind the seat. It keeps things safe, out of the 
weather, under lock and key. The exclusive Club Cab comes two ways this year: regular 
two-wheel drive and all-new four-wheel drive (in many models). See our Club Cabs at our 
showroom today.

see th e  C lu b  C a b  n o w  a t

Dodge ■ ■

AUTHORIZED DEALERS

TUGGLE MOTOR COMPANY, 108 N. Main, Mnenstei

THE CLUB CAB PICKUR



after you see 
your doctor,

bring your 

prescription to

MUENSTER
P H A R M A C Y

PHONE 759-2833

Briscoe Acts Like 
Candidate in 74

Governor Briscoe says he 
likes his job and has given no 
thought to quitting after a sin­
gle term.

While he said he is not ready 
to make a form al announce­
ment, the Governor didn’t 
leave much room for doubt 
that he will seek a second term  
in 1974.

“I have enjoyed this job,”

Dankesreiter
Garage

General Auto Repair 
Air Conditioner Service

311 Division St. 
Phone 759-4521

This Weeks Specials

mM m&

ELURA
SKIN-PART

CAPLESS
WIG

$18

CLEANING AND STYUNG

W ig le ts____________ $2.50

Wigs _ _ _ _ _ _  _ $4.00
CALL 665-0471

Beaudin's 
Beauty Supply

E. Highway 82, Gainesville

GAS RANGE

Model KG3372-A-K-Z
Programmed Controlled Oven 
Continuous Clean Oven 
Cool Oven Door 
Warming Tray
Built in 3 way Exhaust 
Filter System

Clearance Prices on all 73 Models 

Hess Furniture & Western Auto
Muenster, Texas

s a i d  Briscoe. ‘‘I haven’t 
thought about, leaving.”

While he was a t it, Briscoe 
said he sees no reason to 
change his mind about not 
calling a special legislative 
session. He stated flatly he 
does not see one as needed for 

#any purpose.

Kent Bellah Studio 
Saint Jo

Open 10 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Closed Sun., Mon., Tues.

NOTICE OF ELECTION
THE STATE OF TEXAS ) 
COUNTY OF COOKE )
CITY OF MUENSTER )

TO THE RESIDENT. QUALI­
FIED  ELECTORS OF SAID CITY: 

TAKE NOTICE THAT AN ELEC­
TION W ILL BE HELD IN SAID 
CITY AS PROVIDED IN  AN OR­
DINANCE CALLING AN ELEC­
TION DULY PASSED BY THE 
CITY COUNCIL OF SAID CITY, 
WHICH ORDINANCE IS SUB­
STANTIALLY AS FOLLOW S: 

ORDINANCE CALLING 
AN ELECTION 

THE STATE OF TEXAS ) 
COUNTY OF COOKE )
CITY OF MUENSTER )

WHEREAS, to c rea te  M uenster 
W ater D istric t House Bill No. 1582, 
A cts of 1973, 63rd L eg isla tu re , S tate  
of Texas req u ires  th e  City to call 
a confirm ation  election: and 

WHEREAS, it is deem ed neces­
sary  and advisab le  to call the  elec­
tion h e re in a fte r  o rdered ; and 

WHEREAS, it is hereb y  officia lly  
found and d e te rm ined : th a t  a case 
of em ergency  o r u rg en t public 
necessity  ex ists w hich req u ires  the  
holding of th e  m eeting  a t w hich 
th is O rdinance is passed, such 
em ergency  o r u rg en t pub lic  neces­
sity  being th a t estab lish m en t of 
th e  M uenster W ater D istric t is r e ­
qu ired  as soon as possible and 
w ithou t de lay  to fu rn ish  a fu tu re  
w ate r supply  fo r th e  City: and th a t 
said m eeting  was open to  the  p u b ­
lic, and public  notice of th e  tim e, 
place and purpose of said m ee t­
ing w as g iven, all as req u ired  by 
V ernon’s A nn. Civ. S t. A rticle 
6252-17.

THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED 
BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF MUENSTER. TEXAS:

1. T ha t an election shall be held  
on O ctober 27th, 1973, in  said City 
a t th e  follow ing designated  polling 
p lace:

CITY HALL 
MUENSTER, TEXAS 

Said C ity shall constitu te  a single 
elec tion  p rec in c t fo r said election, 
and th e  follow ing elec tion  officers 
are  h e reb y  appo in ted  to  hold said 
e le c tio n :

P res id ing  Ju d g e : Joe Horn, 
A lte rn a te  P resid ing  Ju d g e : Lee 

T oothaker.
2. T ha t th e  P resid ing  Ju d g e  shall 

appo in t no t less th an  tw o qu a li­
fied election  c le rk s to  serve and 
assist in conducting  said election; 
prov ided  th a t  if  th e  P res id ing  Judge 
ac tua lly  serves as expected , th e  
A lte rna te  P resid ing  Ju d g e  shall be 
one of such  clerks.

3. T hat by  approving  and  signing 
th is O rd inance ‘th e  M ayor of said 
C ity officia lly  confirm s his a p ­
po in tm en t of th e  aforesaid  election  
officers to  serve a t said election: 
and by passing th is O rd inance th e  
governing body of said C ity a p ­
proves and  concurs in th e  ap p o in t­
m en t of th e  aforesaid  e lec tion  of- 
ficers.

4. T hat all res iden t, qualified  
elec tors of th e  C ity shall he en ­
titled  to vote. Each e lec to r shall be 
en titled  to  vote once in acco rd ­
ance w ith  th e  req u irem en ts  of th is 
O rdinance.

5. T ha t notice of said election  
shall be given by posting  a sub ­
stan tia l copy of th is O rd inance at 
the  City Hall and a t tw o o ther 
places in said City, no t less than  
15 days p rio r  to th e  d a te  set for 
said election; and  a substan tia l 
copy of th is  O rdinance also shall 
be published on th e  sam e day  in 
each of tw o successive w eeks in a 
new spaper of genera l c ircu la tion  
published in said City, th e  date  of 
th e  f irs t pub lica tion  to be no t less 
th an  14 days p rio r to th e  d a te  set 
fo r said election .

6. T hat a t said elec tion  th e  fo l­
low ing PROPOSITION shall be 
subm itted  in  accordance w ith  law :

PROPOSITION
Shall th e  M uenster W ater D is­

tr ic t be c rea ted  as a conservation  
d is tric t, u n d e r A rticle XVT, Sec­
tion 59 of th e  Texas C onstitu tion  
p u rsu an t to  H ouse Bill 1582, Acts 
of 1973. 63rd L eg isla tu re  of the  
S tate  of Texas?

7. T hat officia l ballo ts fo r said 
elec tion  shall be p repared  in  ac­
cordance w ith  th e  T exas E lection 
Code so as to p e rm it th e  elec tors 
to vote "FO R ” or “A GAINST” th e  
aforesaid  PROPOSITION. w hich 
shall be se t fo rth  in su b stan tia lly  
the  follow ing form , to -w it:

PROPOSITION 
FOR )

) THE DISTRICT 
AGAINST )

8. T hat th e  proposed M uenster
W ater D istric t’s boundaries a re  co­
term inous w ith  th e  C ity’s bound ­
aries of Ja n u a ry  1, 1973. and th a t 
no changes to  th e  C ity ’s b ound ­
aries have occurred  since th a t date.

Foiestbuig
News

By M yrt Denham
FORESTBU RG — Forest- 

burg has a new place of en ter­
tainm ent — a pool hall. The 
folks that run our local cafe 
— the Lovalls — have opened 
up this place in the old rock 
building that belongs to Rex 
Anderson. Now that we have 
this place of action we may 
find our Mercy Bench empty. 
We will probably find Willie 
Kuykendall, M ark Landers, 
Robert Ensey, Jim  Landers 
and Lee Kuykendall shooting 
a few fast games of pool.

■ Met up with Molly Howell 
at our local general store the 
other day. She had caught a 
ride in from Uz w ith her 
neighbor, Glen Lynch, to do 
some shopping. While taking 
her back home Molly told me 
she had been winterizing her 
home. She is covering i t  w ith 
sheet-iron — a “do-it-yourself” 
job. Molly was just as proud 
of it as if she were bricking it. 
We all know Molly has none 
of our modern conveniences 
that we all just couldn’t do 
without — we think. Molly is 
a happy person and doesn’t 
ever seem to complain about 
her lot in life. It sorta makes 
me wonder about the rest of 
us. However, “Miss Molly” has 
it all over the rest of us — she 
is a TV personality and has 
had a one page coverage in a 
W ichita Falls newspaper. Can 
any of us top this?

Comings, doings, visiting, 
and goings in and from this 
area:

The Levi Perrym ans made 
a trip up to Hart, Texas, to vis­
it the J. C. Box family and 
Mrs. Eula Moore on Oct. 6.

Visiting in the Wylie E d­
wards home this past w e e k  
have been the W arren Mar- 
m adukes of Nocona. Also Mrs. 
Mae M artin of Ardmore, Okla., 
and the C. W. M artins of the 
Hardy area. Fm gonna have 
to find out how the Edwards 
and these M arm adukes are 
“hooked up.”

The C. W. Roberts and Loyd 
Orrells attended the Baptist 
Church W orkers Conference 
at Saint Jo Monday night on 
Oct. 8. These w orkers confer­
ences are held once every 
month in a different commun­
ity.

Mrs. Bonita Gresham, who 
now lives at Rosston, visited 
her mother, Eula Bell Boyd of 
Dewey, Wednesday night, Oct. 
11. We have learned tha t Bon­
ita and family have moved in 
a mobile home on the old Akin 
place down at Rosston.

Mrs. Janice Hudspeth, Fort 
Worth, visited her m other Mrs. 
Marge Boyd of Dewey, last 
Thursday nite, Oct. 11.

Guests in this w riter’s home 
Thursday and Friday, Oct. 11 
and 12, were the A. F. Dodsons 
of Fort Worth. The Dodsons 
have been dear and treasured 
friends of ours since our Air 
Force days. We first met the 
summer of 1950 at Biloxi, 
Mississippi.

Mr. and Mrs. John Sockwell, 
Lula Mae Sockwell and Mrs. 
Max Kennan all of Tuscumbia, 
Alabama were guests in the

ran! an midis
G E T  Y O U R  C A R  R E A D Y

For Winter
Let us check youi:

Plugs
Condensor

Brakes
Radiator

Hoses
Tires

Battery
Oil

Points
P. C. V. Valve 

Heater 
Defroster 

Alignment 
Carburetor 

Wiper Blades 
Lubrication

Endies Motor Co.
Muenster, Texas

Our Goal is

No Unhappy Owners
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home of the Howard Sockwells 
this past week. These folks are 
Howard’s Alabama cousins.

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmie Welch 
of Long Beach, California a^e 
here visiting with relatives for 
two weeks. Mrs. Welsch, Mrs. 
W. L. Blankenship and Mrs. 
Lula Sessums are sisters.

O ur little lady Cleo Lanier 
had a dinner party at her 
home, Oct. 7. Her guests were 
the Bennett Reynolds, the 
C h a r l e s  Montgomerys of 
Greenwood, the Gene Laniers 
and children Johnny and Ja n ­
ice and also Wally, Jeff, and 
Tracey Lanier — children of 
the Gerald Laniers.

The Gerald Laniers of the 
Burg and the Sammy Millers 
of Fort Worth took in the an­
nual Huntsville Prison Rodeo 
Sunday, Oct. 7.

The Ted Jacksons and Decie 
Ellzey were three brave souls 
Friday night. They got out in 
the downpour and drove down 
to Greenwood to attend the 
Eastern Star meeting. Speak­
ing of downpours — us Den­
hams received r/z inch on 
Thursday and 3-6/10 inches on 
Friday afternoon and night. 
We are a little water-logged 
here.

The Sunshine Club met Sat­
urday, Oct. 13, at 2 p.m. in the 
Forestburg Community Cen­
ter. Only seven ladies were 
there this time but they sure 
had a nice time. Those a ttend­
ing were Letha Roberts, Molly 
Howell, Juan ita  Bailey, Grace 
Scott, Hettie Landers, Vera 
Mae McGee, and Decie Ellzey.

W ell . . . Stanley parties are 
beginning to get started in this 
area again. Decie Ellzey had 
one at her home Saturday, Oct. 
6, for Helen Poynor of Gaines­
ville. There were nine guests 
present and they enjoyed just 
being together and visiting. 
These parties do give the 
ladies here abouts a chance to 
get together now and then.

Gladys Barclay had one of 
her rare days away from the 
Barclay spread last Thursday. 
She and daughter-in-law, Sheri 
of Saint Jo, made it over to 
Gainesville to do a little re ­
laxing, shopping, and just en­
joy themselves. When a wo­
man works as hard as Gladys 
does — well, she sure needs a 
day “away” every now and 
then.

Doyle Lynch and wife Vir­
ginia attended a cattle sale at 
Pilot Point, Saturday, Oct. 13. 
Understand this was Virginia’s 
first cattle sale. Wonder if she 
could figure out and keep up 
with w hat was going on. Years 
back when sale barns were 
new in this area Loyd Orrell 
attended his first sale a t M uen­
ster. He went to buy some cat­
tle. Well Loyd sat all after­
noon trying to buy some but 
not understanding the Auc­
tioneer’s chant — he came 
home empty handed. Wonder 
if Gerald Lanier has ever 
learned to understand the Auc­
tioneer’s language.

At this writing Mrs. J. J. 
Monroe, Sr., has been a patient 
in the Bridgeport Hospital for 
about a week. We wish Mrs. 
Monroe a speedy recovery.

This last rain  filled up Cobe 
Roach’s swimming pool. Now 
if the days will just get real 
warm again for awhile maybe 
Cobe and his wife can get in 
some swimming before they 
turn  it into an ice skating rink 
this w inter.

Mrs. Billie C. Anderson has 
been appointed a Member of 
M anagement w ith  American 
Airlines. She will serve as a 
Supervisor o f Reservations 
Sales in the Dallas-Fort W orth 
office which handles reserva­
tions for all of Texas, Okla­
homa and Arkansas. Billie is 
the wife of Postm aster Rex 
Anderson of Forestburg.

Glen Lynch is sporting a 
new Chevy pickup truck. I al­
ways t h o u g h t  millionaires 
drove Cadillacs, owned aero­
planes, yachts, etc. Ole Glen 
doesn’t even have a rowboat, 
let alone a yacht or aeroplane. 
He does have two lakes. He 
doesn’t even have any serv­
ants. All my husband and I saw 
when we were out there was 
one combination maid, cook, 
and yardboy tha t Glen got 
some th irty  odd years ago for 
around two dollars.

That drive-through t r e e  
down close to Tommy Richard­
son is slowly settling — accord­
ing to my husband. He says 
Tommy has to lay down pretty 
flat when he drives through it 
on his tractor.

Folks, come Nov. 17 the 
ladies of t h e  Forestburg 
United Methodist Church will 
have their annual bazaar at 
t h e  Forestburg Community 
Center. They will serve a good 
dinner, have all sorts of baked 
goodies for sale plus homemade 
candies. There will also be 
many handmade items for sale. 
This is a fund raising project 
for their church — so do keep 
this in mind and make your 
plans to attend.

Forestburg news from over 
twenty years ago:

(1) Shears to Erect Home:

foundation for a house he will 
move onto the lot across the 
street from the G arland Gilli­
land’s service station in the 
next few days. Homer bought 
one of the wings of the Ross 
Point School building and will 
move it to the lot and remodel 
it to make a home for his mo­
ther and father, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dan Shears, who now live in 
the Denver community. The 
lot was purchased this week 
from Ollie Coleman.

(2) It has been reported from 
a very reliable source (Miss 
Dianna Jones) that S tarr John­
son, popular clerk at the Clov­
er Farm  Store in Forestburg, 
appeared in our litUle city 
barefooted last Monday after­
noon. He has been actin’ 
mighty queer since a certain 
young lady went to San A n­
tonio.

(3) Red Wylie buys Kuyken­
dall Store: Hulet Kuykendall 
has sold his grocery store in 
Forestburg to G. D. (Red) 
Wylie, Jr. Red’s m other will 
help him operate the store, 
and Duber Kuykendall will 
keep his job as a clerk until he 
has to leave for the army.

Hulet says he doesn’t know 
just w hat he will do yet, ex­
cept th a t he will take a good 
rest for a few weeks.

Cousins Honored 
On Confirmation

A supper party  Sunday af­
ter confirmation services hon­
ored cousins, K enneth H art­
man and Christie Felderhoff 
who were members of the 
class. Mr. and Mrs. Alvin H art­
man entertained in their home 
for their son and niece.

Joe Felderhoff was sponsor 
for Kenneth and Miss Monica 
Hartm an was sponsor for 
Christie. Others at the services 
and dinner were Mrs. Joe Fel­
derhoff, Jenny, Anne and Rose 
and grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. Victor H artm an and Mr. 
and Mrs. Tony Felderhoff. Pic­
tures were taken.

Lose Weight 
Safely

with Dex-A-Diet Tablets 
Only 98c at

W A T T S  B R O T H E R S
Gainesville

Romans 10:13. For who­
soever shall call upon the 
nam e of the Lord shall
be saved.

COMPLETE
FUNERAL
SERVICE

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home

The Fiist 
Baptist Chuich

First <S Pecan St. 
Muenster

cordially invites you 
to attend its services
10 a.m. Sunday School 

11 a.m. Worship Service 
6 p.m. Evening Service

Rev. Bill Hatler
Pastor

SPECIAL
at the Dairy Inn

Tues., Wed.,*Thurs., Oct. 23, 24, 25
Barbecue Sandwich

with Drink _ _ _ _ 85c
*ss3s3ssess3esssseess&&3&e3ee&&

Coming Soon
For W eight W atchers & Diabetics 

SUGAR FREE DR. PEPPER

The Dairy Inn
Muenster

Build these garden projects 

m your spare time— inexpensively 

...with SAKRETE
Decorative Block Wall—4' i 1 0 '«  

SAK RET E Cost S7 80 ‘
planter 3 x 5  

S A K R ET E Cost S5 30

Barbecue Pit 32 Inside Oia 
SA K R E1 E Cost S9 90

Patio Floor - 1 0 '  x 12' 
S A K R ET E Cost S45 0Q

With SAKRETE M i x e s —C o n c r e t e , Sand and Mortar-you 
can have beauty that r i c h - l o o k i n g  projects like these 
can bring to your outdoor living area inexpensively-for 
you can build them yourself. SAKRETE products are fun 
and easy to use. High Strength . . .  No 
Waste ... No Measuring. The correct mix 
is in the bag. Just add water.
p n r r  Ask f°r y°ur c°py °* °ur
r n r r  SAKRETE booklet of building
I I I L L .  and repair projects ,,

G  D. SHAMBUROHR
LUMBER COMPANY

Aeeoclate of National Bteldtog Camara, tee.
Phone 759-2232, Muenster
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Lens-View

At the morning coffee the 
pickup gang talks about hunt­
ing. It’s exciting and in terest­
ing to hear them make plans 
about getting their equipment 
ready, what they’ll do about 
the lease, blinds, etc. Some 
optimistic hunters even state 
on what day they will get their 
game and how they’ll take care 
of it. On the list of game to 
be hunted are deer, elk, moose 
and bear.

One group is taking their 
wives along, stating “We want 
to show them the fun we have 
on these hunts” Is that the 
tru th  or were they told by 
their spouses — take us or you 
can’t go. Another idea may be 
— they need a camp cook. On 
the few hunting trips I’ve been 
a lady in the group would have 
caused many changes in cam^ 
life such as the language, 
sleeping accommodations shav­
ing, bathing, all night card 
playing, using the same dish 
w ater two or three days — 
only to mention a few.

A professional photographer 
was to have been at the ground 
breaking ceremony last Sun­
day evening but failed to show 
up. Several persons took pic­
tures and Father Placidus 
would like to see those pictures 
as soon as you have them  de­
veloped.

he stated from 32 to 54 de­
pending how high he pulled 
them up. Remember when his 
mother had a party for him; it 
was when she had him potty 
trained. Two weeks later she 
had another party for him on 
his 15th birthday.

Two out of town men are 
enjoying the hospitality of our 
hospital as a result of separate 
disagreements which ended in 
lacerations- A few beers should 
m ake a person relaxed, happy, 
w anting fun or put him in 
a loving mood, altho for some 
it works the other way.

Ezra was in town this week. 
Looks like what ever he is do­
ing is agreeing with him. When 
asked what size pants he wore

City of Muenster 
Docket

Robert L. Reiter, speeding, 
$26.25.

Charles W. Hacker, Myra, 
speeding, $26.25.

A minor, ran red light, $7.50.
A minor, no drivers license, 

$7.50.
Jerry  Orrell, Forestburg, 

speeding, $25.25.
Carl J. W alterscheid, speed­

ing, $25.50.
J a n e  Monday, speeding, 

$26.25.
Patricia Haverkakmp, speed­

ing, $26.00.
Richard K. Huchton, d is­

charge gun in city, $22.50.
Henry F. Yosten, driver 

license code violation, $7.50.

STATE
in Gainesville

Now thru Sat.
1 showing nightly

'Romeo & Juliet'

PROGRAM
SCHEDULE

Muenster TV-2

Mon., Oct. 22, 8 p.m.
Father Bede's Guest 

Julian Smith 
Gainesville Attorney

calendar of events and 
local w eather dials 

24 hours a day

Hornets —
ing out of the game with an 
injury. He got lots of help in 
that achievement from the de­
pendable blocking of the hard 
hitting line.

Shortly after that the Hor­
nets had another opportunity 
after Terry Huchton blocked 
a kick on the 25. Five plays, 
including Louis Koelzer’s gains 
for 14 and 5 reached the 3, 
then Newcastle recovered a 
fumble across the goal line and 
put it in play on the 20. On 
that series the Cats were set 
back 5 by a penalty and 12 by 
the Hornets before fumbling 
on the 3. Randy Wolf scored 
from there. The Hornets led 
12- 0.

Following the next kickoff 
Newcastle made two first 
downs and lost a fourth quar­
ter gamble on the third series. 
Muenster got the ball in mid- 
field and five tries w ent the 
distance. Three of those were 
by Klement for gains of 12 and 
21 and the scoring play for 17. 
That was early in the second 
quarter and the game was over 
as far as the score was con­
cerned.

On next possession the Hor­
nets made a nice drive but 
lacked the scoring punch. 
They went 46 yards in nine 
plays including their only pass 
completion of the night, a 19 
yard heave from Wolf to Dan 
Sicking. With first down on 
the 9 they appeared to have 
another score cinched, but four 
plays later they were out of 
downs on the 10.

The second half was more of 
a contest as M uenster gave up 
possession on five turnovers 
and Newcastle only twice. Also 
the visitors connected on sev­
eral passes. The net result was 
that M uenster gained 80 yards 
and Newcastle 25. In the third 
period the Hornets drove 40 to 
the Bobcat 40 and fumbled. At 
other times they fumbled on 
Newcastle’s 17 and 27 and once 
ran out of plays on the 16. 
Statistics M N
First downs 15 10
Yards rushing 201 77
Yards passing 19 58
Passes completed 1-7 7-18
Intercepted by 1 1
Fumbles lost by 5 3
Yards penalized 39 90

FOR EATING OUT PLEASURE
if’ i
l l P w l i d

m m

M i s

Bring the Whole Family!
Dad, treat Mom and the kids to dinner out 
with plenty of good food in our pleasant 
atmosphere with warm, friendly service.

We Close Every Wednesday

The Center
A Favorite Spot for Family Dining

Tigers - - -
they got 45 yards for free on 
three penalties, after which 
Strickland went for 12 yards. 
They had a set up on the 7. 
Second try  reached the 1 and 
Strickland w ent over on a 
quarterback sneak. It was 
Callisburg’s second score of 
the season.

On their next possession the 
Tigers fumbled after a short 
gain, and Callisburg had a 
punt blocked at the end of its 
first series. Moster scooped up 
and scored but a clip ruling 
nullified the effort. Then John 
Bartush took a 17 yard pass 
from Roger Endres and made 
a great 22 yard run to pay dirt.

The second of three blocked 
Wildcat kicks gave the Tigers 
good field position for their 
fourth touchdown. Five plays 
were enough for the 22 yards 
and the point maker was 
Davey K rahl’s crash through 
for 4. A pass ffom Endres to 
Bartush made the count 28-6 
at the half time.

Another blocked kick end­
ing Callisburg’s first series of 
the second half was another 
fine opportunity for the Tig­
ers. There were 8 yards to go, 
a pass to Bartush gained 7 and 
Moster went over.

Next tim e Callisburg got the 
kick away and Sacred Heart 
was 47 yards away. Two plays 
made the distance, 14 by Krahl 
and 33 by Moster.

For the rest of the game 
there was a great deal of sub­
stitution and only a few reg­
ulars played at any time. That 
improved the contest consider­
ably as each team managed for 
three first downs but neither 
was able to keep going. At one 
point the first string came in 
for one play, a field goal a t­
tem pt by Mark Hess — which 
missed. There were two ex­
changes during tha t time, 
once when M ark Hess stole the 
ball from a runner and once
when Callisburg intercepted.
Statistics SH C
First downs 14 5
Yards rushing 248 61
Yards passing 36 -1
Passes completed 3-9 1-3
Intercepted by 0 2
Fumbles lost by 1 2
Penalties 7-85 3-25

HD Club to Cheer 
Hospital Patients 
With Yule Gifts

Members of M uenster Horne 
Demonstration Club faced a 
full agenda at their October 
meeting when Mrs. Ray Kle­
ment was hostess in her home.

The group agreed to again 
send Christm as cheer to pa ti­
ents a t Wichita Falls State 
Hospital and will donate, wrap 
and pack gifts at their Novem­
ber meeting w hen Mrs. Bruno 
Fleitm an is hostess in her 
home.

They also discussed attend­
ance at a four-series program 
on “Stretching the Food Dol­
lar” to be held each Monday 
of November at 2 p.m. in the 
TP&L Reddy Room at Gaines­
ville. Registration for the full 
course is $1.00.

Also planned was participa­
tion in the annual “Christmas 
in November” program at 
Gainesville on Nov. 15 and 16 
when they will show crafts, 
hobbies and gifts — ideas for 
Christmas gifting.

Members also planned t o 
attend the county-wide Christ­
as party to be hosted this year 
by the Era Home Dem onstra­
tion Club in their club house 
on December 11.

An individual cash contribu­
tion by members resulted in 
a sizeable sum for Hillcrest 
Manor Auxiliary to be used 
for game prizes for the nurs­
ing home’s residents at their 
weekly parties.

For the program  Mrs. Rufus 
Moore of Callisburg and Mrs. 
Jay  Pybas of Sivells Bend told 
about the state HDC conven­
tion they attended in Waco as 
delegates from Cooke County.

Mrs. Paul Fisher, president, 
presided. After the opening 
prayer and pledge Mrs. Bill 
Lutkenhaus read a paper on 
the prim ary purpose of Home 
Demonstration Clubs and fol­
lowed with a short inspiration­
al reading spiked w ith hum or 
entitled “Not Every Woman a 
M other Makes.”

Mrs. Rudy Heilman gave the 
county council report which 
included the dates of coming 
activity.

After adjournm ent the hos­
tess served dessert and coffee 
to 15 members and two guests.

Court Dispute Over Gas Threatens 
Local Power Supply This Winter

Texas Power & Light Com­
pany and two other electric 
companies will be hardpressed 
to supply electricity to four 
million people in 99 counties 
this w inter if they lose a pend­
ing natural gas case, the 
Railroad Commission was in­
formed Monday.

J  F. Skelton, President of 
Texas Power & Light Com­
pany, said that “More than 
one-third of all Texas resi­
dents could face power cur­
tailm ents this w inter if the 
Texas Railroad Commission 
confiscates gas owned by the 
TU System and awards it to 
the cities of Austin and San 
Antonio, the Lower Colorado 
Authority and the University 
of Texas.”

The TU system is composed 
of TP&L, Dallas Power & 
Light Company and Texas 
Electric S e r v i c e  Company. 
These three firms supply elec­
tric power to more than 323 
m unicipalities in 99 counties 
in North, East, Central and 
West Texas. Included are such 
cities as Waco, Tyler, Sherman, 
Lufkin, Temple and Brown- 
wood.

“Over the past 20 years, 
Texas Power & Light and the 
other TU companies have spent 
many millions of dollars to in­
sure an adequate fuel supply 
for our power plant needs,” 
Skelton explained. “This w in­
ter, the TU system is vitally 
dependent on gas supplies it 
owns in West Texas,” he con­
tinued. “W ithout the availabil­
ity of this fuel, our capacity 
to produce electric power could 
be seriously impaired.”

The dispute involves a mo­
tion filed before the Railroad 
Commission by the cities of 
Austin, San Antonio, t h e  
Lower Colorado River A uthor­
ity and the University of Texas 
System.

In this motion, the Appli­
cants allege that beginning 
November 1, LO-VACA Gath­
ering Company, a commercial 
seller of natural gas, will begin 
“diverting” gas from them to 
the TU System. The motion 
asks th^.t the Railroad Com­
mission halt this action.

TP&L and the other com­
panies, however, contend in 
their countermotion filed Mon­
day with the Railroad Com­
mission that it owns the gas 
in question and that neither 
LO-VACA or any of LO- 
VACA’s customers have any 
legal right to the fuel.

In 1970, Texas Utilities Fuel 
Company (TUFCO), a subsidi­
ary of TU, entered into an 
agreement with LO-VACA in 
which TUFCO would pay 60%

of the costs involved in the 
construction of a 395-mile gas 
pipeline from Pecos County to 
the Dallas-Fort . Worth area. 
TUFCO’s financial participa­
tion in the project amounted 
to more than $42 million. By 
this transaction, TUFCO ac­
quired title and ownership to 
the West Texas gas which 
would be transported through 
the pipeline. Construction of 
the pipeline was completed in 
1971.

In the agreem ent with LO- 
VACA, TUFCO p e r m i t t e d  
“spot” sales of lim ited quanti­
ties of TUFCO’s West Texas 
gas until it was needed by 
DP&L, TESCO and TP&L. On 
November 1, the TUFCO gas 
will be needed by the TU Sys 
tern and will no longer be 
available to LO-VACA or any 
of LO-VACA’s customers.

The cities of Austin, and 
San Antonio, the Lower Colo­
rado River A uthority and the 
University of Texas, as cus­
tomers of LO-VACA, have ap­
pealed to the Railroad Com­
mission to prevent TUFCO 
from taking its fuel.

In t h e i r  countermotion 
TP&L and the other companies 
stated, “The Applicants seek 
the aid of this commission to 
confiscate and divert to their 
own use the gas which is in­
deed the property of TUFCO, 
the result of which would be 
to jeopardize the health and 
welfare of the residential and 
business community of North, 
Central, East and West Texas 
which represents more than 
one-third of the  people of 
Texas.

“We have gone to great 
lengths to prepare for the elec­
tric needs of oyr customers,” 
Skelton said. “We have ac­
curately forecast these needs 
and have diligently prepared 
for them. Apparently, the o th­
er parties involved have not.

In the countermotion, TP&LX 
and the other companies ask 
that the Railroad Commission 
deny the Applicants’ motion. 
This denial would prevent LO- 
VACA from  taking TUFCO’s 
gas. The countermotion fu r­
ther states that “The Railroad) 
Commission does not have the 
legal authority to apportion 
West Texas gas among LO- 
VACA’s customers since there 
can be no apportionm ent of 
gas which LO-VACA does not 
own.”

As an alternative m easure 
the countermotion asks for 
oral argum ents before the 
three commissioners.

Skelton said he expected the 
Railroad Commission to be­
gin hearings on the m atter 
w ithin two weeks.

IT HAPPENED 
35 YEARS AGO

Oct. 14. 1938
Electric Co-op continues to 

hasten line construction. Mi­
nor fire in boat causes facial 
burns to H erbert Meurer. Bur­
glars get only $3.00 in pennies 
in burglary a t Bright Gable 
Inn. Funeral services are held 
in Gainesville for J. M. Havis. 
Bullet wound causes death of 
Lum Pierce, milk hauler from 
Forestburg. Jonesboro’s Bene­
dictine Sisters observe fiftieth 
year of the establishm ent of 
their convent in the diocese 
of L ittle Rock, Ark. Dorothy 
Kathman, bride-elect of Paul 
Fisher is honoree at gift party. 
Miscellaneous shower honors 
Adeline Yosten, bride-elect of 
Bernard Sicking.

30 YEARS AGO
Oct. 15, 1943

Garden C l u b  announces 
flower show for November 10. 
Baptists begin moving building 
for church to their lots this 
week. Joe Tempel reports for 
Navy training. A group of 
little friends help Ray Luke 
celebrate his eighth birthday. 
Lt. Chaplain Francis Zimmer- 
er ends visit with family and 
friends and returns to Fort 
Gordon, Ga. Pvt. Vincent Fel- 
derhoff, on duty with the 36th 
Division in Italy, w rites tha t 
he has recovered from a 
sprained ankle.

25 YEARS AGO
Oct. 15, 1948

Robert Hesse, 4, dies after 
life-long fight w ith incurable 
disease. Sunday’s 1.11 inch 
rain b r e a k s  three-m onth 
drought. Mack Reed, 63, pio­
neer Myra resident dies of 
heart attack. Mrs. J. P. Fisch, 
87, breaks hip in fall. M uen­
ster VFW Post gets hospital 
bed for community use. Get- 
Together Club re-elects Mrs. 
Jake Pagel president. Garden 
Club m em bers make conser­
vation tour to inspect soil sav­
ing practices. Bill and Alvin 
Fuhrm an, Herbie Miller and 
Leo Hesse retu rn  from trip 
to Carlsbad Caverns.

20 YEARS AGO
Oct. 16. 1953

Funeral services are held for 
Charles Cler, 75, M uenster res­
ident for 47 years. Work on 
city pavem ent begins with 
ten blocks assured as starter. 
Cpl. Ted Noggler is enroute 
home from Korea. Subm ariner 
A rthur Hennigan, serving on 
the Redfish, is at home on 
leave. Engagement of Gracie 
Friske and Alvin Fuhrm an is 
announced. Michael Neu wins 
state 4-H tractor m aintenance 
contest and gets trip to Chica­
go. The A lbert Schillings of 
Seminole are a t home for a 
visit. Garden Club plans b irth ­
day calendar. W illiam Fisher 
and Richard Hellinger win 
superior awards on turkeys at 
State Fair. Clifford Endres 
starts back to school on cru t­
ches after being absent since 
Sept. 19 on account of a bro­
ken leg.

15 YEARS AGO
Oct. 17. 1958

Mrs. C. J. Tuggle, long-time 
Myra resident, dies a t her 
home Sunday. Gwen Friske 
wins top state honors at 4-H 
gardener. Jerry  Fette and 
Delette McKee m arry in Waco. 
Rosina Hess and Leroy Sch- 
m idlkofer wed in Muenster. 
Mrs. Annie Needham has re ­
turned to Waco after a visit 
w ith her son Frank Needham 
and family. Scoutm aster Nick 
Miller gets surprise birthday 
party from troop. Mr. and 
Mrs. Edwin Schula of Wisner, 
Neb., back for their first visit 
with the Yosten families in 23 
years, are amazed at Muen- 
ster’s growth.

10 YEARS AGO
Oct. 18. 1963

City council okays new Sixth 
Street bridge. Homecoming at 
M uenster High will honor 1953 
graduates. VFW 'Post and 
Auxiliary make plans to spon­
sor Thanksgiving picnic and 
dinner. Dr. L. O. Laughlin 
starts practice of medicine 
here. Danny Fette breaks left 
arm. Forty-five boys compete 
in PP&K contest and 12 win 
prizes. Henry Fleitm an gets 
army discharge. Dennis L ut­
kenhaus and Ralph and F ran­
cis Hermes win top honors on 
broilers in county 4-H show. 
Pete Prescher has top butter- 
fat producers among DHIA 
cows. House blessing held at 
Henry Pels Jr. new home. 
CDA plan annual Christmas 
bazaar. Mrs. George Lutken­
haus goes to New York to a t­
tend funeral of son-in-law 
George W itherell. Attendance 
at Mass and communion break­
fast m ark observance of Col­
umbus Day by local KCs. New 
arrivals: boys for Messrs, and 
Mmes. Jerry  Fette, Gene John­
son, Richard Allen,, Henry 
Kuhn Jr. and Bernard Luke; 
a girl for the Ray Voths.

5 YEARS AGO
Oct. 18. 1968

Religious and social event 
observe Columbus Day by local 
KC council . . . Lee Toothaker 
receives this year’s G o o d  
Neighbor Award. New-type 
lights on church grounds flood 
SH Church. Hornets crush 
Sadler-Southm ayd Rams 74-0. 
Tigers lose 46-13 to Anna Coy­
otes. SH class attends Dallas 
Journalism  Forum and Nixon 
Rally. Tony’s feed lot has 60 
steers i n feeding project. 
Adult education classes are or ­
ganized w ith Mr. and Mrs. 
Jam es Shelton as teachers. 
The Allen Reiter family moves 
to Dallas. Six local PP&K 
winners advance to McKinney 
meet. Funeral is held at Pilot 
Point for M i s s  Christine 
Roewe, 80. SH School observes 
National School Lunch Week. 
New arrivals: boys for Messrs, 
and Mmes. Henry Popp, Gary 
Cler and Tommy Gressett; 
girls for the Augie Knabes, 
Tommy Zimmerers and Larry 
Joe Walterscheids..

4-H Club 
News

Community Club Meets
Members of the M uenster 

Community 4-H Club at their 
meeting on October 9 made 
posters for 4-H Week and dis­
cussed the county-wide project 
fair to be held on Saturday 
the 13. They also heard a re ­
port on the county council 
meeting by Barbie Davidson.

Mary Lou Fleitman presided 
at the meeting which was a t­
tended by 17 members, three 
adult leaders, two guests, and 
Agents Ava Knapp and Randy 
Jordan. The meeting adjourned 
with the 4-H prayer.

A pious and venerable man, 
having lived a long and useful 
life, died and went to his re ­
ward. Years later his old friend 
also died and upon arriving in 
the other side went searching 
for his old friend. To his de­
light, he found him sitting on 
a large fluffy cloud with a 
beautiful blonde on his lap.

“Wow!” shouted the friend, 
‘‘you sure have been given 
your rew ard!”

‘‘Reward, nothing,” replied 
the old man, “I’m her punish­
m ent.”

Confetti —
of its debt requirem ent.

The whole situation in a few
words is that immediate con­
struction of the reservoir will 
have us ready if the crisis 
comes soon. Our problem 
might be dry wells or pollu­
tion by salt or oil. While we’re 
waiting, however, we are pay- 
almost $32,000 a year for a 
facility that is producing noth­
ing. That time is estimated at 
10-20 years and it could be 

donger.
So the question is w hether 

or not to approve the project 
in the coming referendum . 
Should the city pay a stiff 
price to have the lake avail­
able at once? Or should it keep 
an eye on the water level and 
take on the lake project when 
it becomes necessary? — and 
start paying on the obligation 
when necessity requires us to.

A factor to consider is the 
cost sharing deal with SCS. 
The funds may no longer be 
available when the lake be­
comes necessary. But one 
should also consider the com­
m unity’s a n n u a l  payments 
could become higher than the 
cost to be saved in the SCS 
deal.

Furtherm ore, it’s not certain 
that SCS help will be w ith­
drawn. Nor is it certain that 
the city needs flood control 
and recreation with its res­
ervoir.

One point is definite. A w a­
ter district is authorized for 
Muenster, and its validity will 
not expire. We can decide on 
the lake now or several years 
from now, whichever we pre­
fer. I t’s up to us to decide 
which course is wiser, to ap­
prove the lake now or w ait a 
while.

Douglas Stoffels has gone to 
Bakersfield, Calif., to be em ­
ployed. He’s the son of Mrs. 
Meinrad Stoffels.

The best years of a m an’s 
life are when the kids are old 
enough to help shovel snow 
but too young to drive the car.

Everyone shuns trouble, un­
less it comes disguised as 
money.

Receipt Books
NCR (No Carbon) 

300 per book

Adding Machine 
Tape

The Enterprise

Muenster
Livestock
Auction

SALE EVERY THURSDAY
We offer our 

service to assist you 
in buying or selling 

of live stock.

Bill & Sam Hamer
Phone 759-2201

Small, Tender

Spare Ribs _ _ _ _ _ _ lb. 89c

Chuck Roast _ _ _ _ _  lb. 89c 

Arm Roast _ _ _ _ _ _ lb. 95c

Seven Roast _ _ _ . _ lb. 95c

Ground Beef _ _ _ _ _ lb. 87c

H & W Smoked Sausage lb. $1.49 

Decker Slab B acon_____lb. 99c

CHOICE BEEF
from our own feed lot 

for your freezer.

W hole Carcass, Halves, Quarters.

We also will slaughter & 
custom process your animal.
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We Close Saturday at Noon

H&W M eat Co.
Muenster. 759-2744


