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A few official policies in
Washington can also be in­
cluded as having a bearing on 
the situation. Tax reformers 
eager to remove a so called tax 
loophole had depletion allow­
ance reduced and the result 
was a decline in oil explora­
tion. It’s been dem onstrated 
that the oil industry needs a 
generous depletion allowance 
even though a few people are 
making big money at it.

The same can be said for 
regulating gas prices. Because 
the price has been held down 
inducement for exploration is 
also curtailed. At the same 
tim e use has rocketed because 
the controlled price keeps it 
cheaper than other fuels. This 
fact is given as a reason why 
gas pressure was down and 
some facTories had to close 
during severe w eather of last 
winter.

We hear so much nowadays
about the coming shortage of 
gasoline that we’re already be­
coming resigned to it. We ac­
cept as fact the prediction that 
the price is sure to go up and 
that rationing is very probably 
on the way. Meanwhile we 
hope that the big fellows in 
governm ent and industry will 
find a way to keep us out of 
a strain.

Doing that, you can bet, will 
require some close looks at a 
num ber of factors which have 
combined to bring on the 
crisis. Then it will become 
necessary to look for ways to 
accomplish all possible changes 
which seem to be advised by 
past experience.

Of course we find some u n ­
avoidable causes — such as 
the severe w inter we have had. 
Vast increases in the demand 
for heating oil resulted in use 
of more crude for that pur­
pose, hence a decrease in the 
crude that was available for 
gasoline So, now we are ap­
proaching the season of in ­
creased automobile travel with 
a shorter supply of fuel on 
hand. To make m atters worse 
we have increasing numbers 
of the federally required emis­
sion control devices which 
sharply decrease the mileage 
per gallon. We can’t do any­
thing about the acts of God, 
but hopefully something can 
be done about the acts of man.

Perhaps the greatest of all
our problems is the fact that 
we have gone to extrem es in 
ecology demands. Air quality 
standards have been set un­
realistically high, ruling out 
the use of some fuels that 
could relieve the strain but 
are not permitted, to. Those in­
clude large amounts of resid­
ual fuel oil and large amounts 
of coal with a relatively high 
surphur content. Official re ­
strictions also prohibit extrac­
tion of major coal deposits by 
strip  mining.

One wonders whether the 
high quality of air demanded 
by ecologists is really neces 
sary. Obviously a big step to­
ward solution of the energy 
crisis could be taken if the na­
tion would settle for a little 
less perfection and go back to 
using the forbidden fuels. As 
regards automobiles a great 
deal could be accomplished by 
demanding less quality in e x ­
haust while developing engines 
that use the gasoline more 
completely.

The automoiive industry's
approach to t h e  problem 
seemed absurd from the begin­
ning. It has been performance 
conscious, striving for speed 
and acceleraton ra ther t h a n  
economy. A result was dirty 
exhaust, which could have 
been changed by improving 
engine efficiency But no, the 
aim is still high performance 
e v e n  though that expensive 
junk has to be hanged on to 
clean up the emission.

Still more m istakes by en
vironm entalist groups need to 
be considered in looking for 
solutions. They have delayed 
the construction and operation 
of nuclear power plants. They 
have prevented vast projects 
of offshore drilling because of 
comparatively few oil leaks. 
And the prize of all absurities 
was blocking construction of 
the Alaska pipeline which 
could be relieving much of our 
present oil shortage. The first 
question is why be afraid of 
it when dozens of such lines 
a r e  operating successfully? 
Next question is where could 
a leak cause less trouble than 
in the wide open spaces of Al­
aska?

MHS Awards Banquet 
Honors Top Students

Outstanding s t u d e n t s  in 
studies and sports were recog- 
niged Monday night in the an­
nual all-awards banquet spon­
sored by the M uenster Parent 
Teachers Association.

It was the event which re ­
vealed several selections for 
top awards of the year along 
with recognitions of many 
more students for their partic­
ipation in scholatic and athletic 
activity.

Lyle Klement was awarded 
the Hornet Hustler trophy, the 
school’s mcst coveted prize in 
sports. As pointed out by 
Coach Glenn Richardson he 
earned it by hard work as well 
as achievement. A n o t h e r  
awaited announcement by the 
coach is the election of Terry 
Hucht.on, Curtis Klement and 
Lyle Klement as captains of 
next year’s Hornet football 
team.

Richardson s p o k e  briefly 
saying the year was good to 
MHS in sports. The football re ­
cord of 5-5 was good consider­
ing many injuries, girls did 
well in their first effort at 
track and the boys likewise 
did well with third in district 
for the seniors and first in 
district for the juniors, also 
that Mark Lippe and Lyle 
Klement, qualifying for the 
state meet, rate a title equiva­
lent to all-state in track.

Scholastic champions of the 
year were selected from three 
nominees of each department. 
The name of the nominees of 
each depart are as follows.

English: P a t t i  D ittfurth, 
Charlotte Johnson, Leila Grant.

Science: Dean Sicking, Mon­
te Reiter, Diane Yosten.

Spanish: Mark Lippe, Patti 
D ittfurth, Phillip Russell.

History: Patti D ittfurth, Joe 
Swirczynski, Lois Sicking.

Mathematics: C u r t i s  Kle­
ment, Glenn Henscheid, John­
ny Eckart.

Athletic girl: Doris Felder- 
hoff, Becky Fields, Sandra 
Dittfurth.

Athletic boy: Mark Lippe, 
Randy Wolf, Lyle Klement.

Business: P a m  Schneider, 
Patti D ittfurth, Janice Fisher.

Industrial arts: Lonnie Hell- 
man, Jim  Endres, Johnny Eck­
art.

Agriculture: Lyle Klement, 
Dean Sicking, Ray Luke.

Homemaking: Janet Wim- 
mer, Lanita Reid, Mary Lou

Fleitman.
Band: Lola Bright, Becky 

Jaska, Lenora Fleitman.
Special awards on recom­

mendation of the faculty were 
announced as follows. DAR 
Good Citizen, Marlene Herr. 
Betty Crocker Homemaker of 
Tcmmorrow, Janice Fisher. 
3alfuur Award, Patti Dittfurth. 
All-Round Girl, Darlene Wolf. 
All-Rcund Boy, Curtis Kle­
ment. National Math Exam 
High Scorer, Curtis Klement.

Also named were teachers’ 
selections to Outstanding Teen­
agers of America as follows: 
Jim Endres, Doris Felderhoff, 
Mark Lippe, Barbara Davidson, 
Curtis Klement. And the fol­
lowing selections for O utstand­
ing American High School S tu­
dents: Marlene Herr, Lonnie 
Heilman, Lyle Klement, Doris 
Felderhoff, Jim  Endres, Mark 
Lippe, Barbara Davidson, Cur­
tis Klement.

Recognitions included of­
ficers of the four classes, the 
JETS club, the YEP club, FHA, 
the FFA officers and team 
members. Also the mem ber­
ship of the National Honor So­
ciety, the annual staff, the 
marching band and stage band, 
baseball, tennis, volleyball, 
golf, basketball, football and 
track teams.

Also named were all those 
who participated in litrary 
events of the interscholastic 
league and their scoring in the 
competition.

Charles Woolfolk, president 
of the Gainesville Area Charm- 
ber of Commerce, was a spec­
ial on the program praising 
the students for their achieve­
ments and extending his or­
ganization’s appreciation for 
whatever recognition t h e y  
bring to the area.

Another very brief talker 
was Superintendent L. B. 
Bruns saying it’s been a good 
school year, thanks to the ef­
forts of the students, the fac­
ulty and the parents.

Ernest Jaska, PTA presi­
dent was Master of ceremon­
ies ahd extended the PTA 
welcome a n d  appreciations. 
Doris Felderhoff responded 
for the students, Joe Bright 
gave the invocation and Patti 
D ittfurth the benediction.

Bob Hayes and his Hornet 
Stage Band provided enter 
tainmenit and Rohmer’s ca­
tered.

Nominees Wanted 
For Outstanding 
Citizen Award

Who is your choice for the 
Outstanding Citizen of the 
Year award to be presented by 
the Jaycees at their upcoming 
banquet?

The Jaycees would appreci­
ate a few nominations, so 
they’re inviting folks to have 
their say at a community re ­
ferendum this weekend.

Ballot boxes will be set up 
Thursday, Friday and Saturday 
at Pagel’s, Fisher’s, Hofbauer’s 
and the Bank, and interested 
persons are asked to indicate 
their preference.

Regarding the installation 
and aw ards' banquet date, the 
committee is having problems 
but expects to have it within 
two weeks.

Scouts to Attend 
County Camporee 
Friday, Saturday

Scouts of M uenster’s Troop, 
No. 664, will be one of several 
participating this weekend in 
a camporee of all Boy Scouts 
in Cooke County The event 
will be held Friday night and 
Saturday a t the Gainesville 
Scouts camping area on old 
Highway 77 north of Gaines­
ville.

M uenster boys will assemble 
at the KC Hall Friday at 4:30 
for their rides to the camp­
site. Extra transportation will 
be needed, so a few volunteers 
will be appreciated.

Activity, besides camping 
and cooking chores, will con­
sist of competition between 
patrols on scouting skills, ap­
pearance of trooop area, etc. 
And there will be a tap-out of 
scouts selected for the Order 
of the Arrow.

Activity ends at 6 p.m. Sat- 
uday after which boys will 
pack up tents and equipment. 
They should be ready to be 
picked up from 7 to 8 o’clock.

Get Nurse Caps
Miss Mary Bayer, daughter 

of Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Bayer, 
Muenster, and Miss Mary 
Schad, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Schad of Lindsay 
were among nursing students 
capped in ceremonies at TWU 
in Denton Sunday. Parents 
and other relatives attended 
the program. Mrs. G ertrude 
Bayer accompanied t h e  Al- 
rred Bayers.

CCD Second Graders Receive First Holy Communion
The sound of organ and 

trum pets accompanied four­
teen young CCD students as 
they walked with their pastor 
in solemn procession to open 
the special liturgy of their 
First Communion Day. Aco­
lytes Ray and Damian Luke 
and Mark Jaska led them to 
the sanctuary. There, the first 
communicants a t the altar, 
holding lighted candles, re­
newed their baptismal prom­
ise.*.

In the offertory procession, 
the communicants presented 
symbolic gifts. The lighted 
Christ Candle, carried by 
J a m e s  Bright, represented 
Christ the Light of the World. 
Billy Growing carried an a r­
rangement of grapes a n d

wheat, symbolic of the Eucha­
rist. A lily, symbolic of inno­
cence and purity was carried 
by Julia Grewing. A plaque 
bearing the name of the Mis­
sion child adopted by the class 
was presented by Connie Lut- 
kenhaus.

Susan Bayer carried the wa­
ter and wine; Renee Wimmer, 
the paten w ith a large host. 
The ciborium containing the 
gift of bread was presented by 
Carl Sicking and Duane Wal- 
terscheid carried the collection 
basket. Lighted tapers w e r e  
carried by Dora Sicking, Vir­
ginia Fisher, Lisa Serna, Sara 
Walterscheid, Brad Biffle, and 
Kevin Felderhoff.

At communion time, the chil­

dren approached Father indi­
vidually and he called each by 
name as he presented “The 
Body of Christ.”

At conclusion of Mass the 
group left as they entered in 
solemn procession with their 
pastor and acolytes Dean Sick­
ing and Kent Fuhrman.

Sister Genevieve instructed 
the class. Pat Hennigan Jr. was 
organist, Ronnie and Milissa 
Weinzapfel played the trum ­
pets, and Sister Yvonne and 
her Sacred Heart G irls’ Chorus 
provided choral selections.

Special guests at the services 
were the class-room teacher of 
the communicants Mrs. Jose­
phine Inglish of Rosston, par­
ents. families and grandpar­
ents.

All of those factors had a
bearing on the energy crisis 
now facing the country*, and 
all of them are mistakes So, 
i t’s obvious that some of the 
answers the country is looking 

(Continued on Page 10)

FIRST COMMUNICANTS, front row, left to right — Brad Biffle, Dora Sicking, Sara 
W alterscheid, Julia Grewing, Connie Lutkenhaus, James Bright. SECOND ROW — Duane 
Walterscheid, Susan Bayer, Lisa Serna, Renee Wimmer, Virginia Fisher, Carl Sicking. 
THIRD ROW — Kevin Felderhoff, Father Placidus, Billy Grewing. BACK ROW — Sis­
ter Genevieve, Damian Luke, Ray Luke, M ark  Jaska, Dean Sicking, Kent Fuhrman.

34 from Muenster 
Win Ribbons in 
4-H Dress Revue

April raindrops brought a 
shower of fashions from 75 
Cooke County 4-H’ers — 34 
of them from M uenster — at 
the 1973 4-H Dress Revue Sun­
day afternoon.

Whaley United Methodist 
Church was the scene where 
70 girls and five boys showed 
what they had learned about 
fashion, clothing construction 
and accessories during the past 
two months.

Taking top honors in the 
junior division was Christy 
Felderhoff of Sacred Heart. 
First runner-up and district al­
ternate in the senior division 
is Barbie Davidson of Muen­
ster Community Club.

First and alternate senior 
girls and first place interm edi­
ate girl will represent Cooke 
County in the district dress 
revue in July.

An audience of about 175 a t­
tended to view fashions rang­
ing from Easter attire to swim 
suits and everything in be­
tween. This annual event is 
sponsored by the F irst State 
Bank of Gainesville.

Ten senior girls presented 
the fashion commentary for 
ten seniors, 40 interm ediates 
and 20 juniors, and five boys.

Other ribbon winners from 
Muenster are:

Seniors — Sandy Reiter, SH, 
blue; Mary Lou Fleitman, C, 
blue; Kim Reiter, SH, blue; 
Janet Sicking, SH, Red.

Interm ediates — Blue ribbon 
winners from SH: Dona Sw ir­
czynski, Cheryl Luke, Monica 
Gehrig, Mary Luke, Laurie 
Walterscheid, Carolyn L u k e ,  
Mary Grewing. Red — Brenda 
Voth, Dina Rohmer.

Interm ediates — M uenster 
Community Club, Blue: Pat 
Davidson, Debbie Zimmerer. 
Red — Kathy Davidson, Con­
nie Flusche, Cathy Flusche.

Juniors — SH, Blue: Renee 
Wilde, D e n i s e  Haverkarrip, 
Rose Felderhoff, Bernadette 
Knabe, Nancy Luke, Marlene 
Swirczynski, Reneta W alter­
scheid. Red — Colynda Hen­
scheid, B r e n d a  Felderhoff, 
Carla Otto.

Juniors — Community Club, 
Blue: Claudia Flusche.

Boys — Blue ribbons to bro­
thers John, Gary and Deryl 
Zimmerer of Community Club.

The Men 
In Service

Settled In Germany
Tom Trachta is settled at 

Heidelberg, Germany, on his 
new assignment w ith t h e  
Army overseas. His wife Sue 
is counting the days until she 
can join him . . . sometime 
this month. Tom’s address is: 
Sp. 4 Thomas Trachta, 460-80- 
1784; USA D tat Svc. Cen. Eur. 
Out. Con.; AF>0 New York, 
N.Y. 09403.

To Spell Saturday
M arilyn Otto, Sacred Heart 

eighth grader, and Cooke 
County’s spelling champion, 
will try  f o r  another crown 
Saturday in the regional spell- 
off at Dallas. The contest will 
be televised on WFAA-TV at 
11 a.m. M arilyn is the daugh­
ter of the Mr. and Mrs. John­
ny Otto.

W ilbert Vogel arrived from 
Alger, Algerie, Friday on a 
m onth’s vacation from duties 
with Baker Tool Co. He timed 
bis vacation to attend the wed­
ding of his sister Lillian Vogel 
and W ilfred W alterscheid on 
May 19. He is spending part 
of this week in Houston. At 
the end of his vacation he will 
go to London, England.

Wayne Grewing, student at 
Ryder Technological Institute 
in Dallas, has taken on a full 
time shift working for Central 
Freight Lines as a mechanic 
at the end of his school day.

PTA Meeting Postponed
Members of M uenster PTA 

are reminded that their next 
meeting has been postponed 
from next Monday, May 7, to 
Monday, May 21. The change 
was made because of a con­
flict w ith  church services. 
Meeting time on the 21st will 
be 7:30 p.m.

Receive Ford Awards
John Yosten and Otto Wal­

terscheid were among the 
honored guests at a parts and 
service awards banquet spon­
sored by Ford Motor Company 
ih Dallas Saturday n igh t..

The awards are in recogni­
tion of outstanding efforts in 
Ford’s current “No Unhappy 
Owners” c a m p a i g n .  John 
heads the service departm ent 
and Otto the parts departm ent 

I at Endres Motor Co.

Hennigan Auto Parts 
Moves to New Home

Following a big moving pro­
ject during the past weekend, 
Hennigan Auto Parts is in 
business since Monday in its 
bright and spacious new loca­
tion.

About fifteen helpers from 
the firm ’s m ajor suppliers 
joined the Hennigans in trans­
ferring merchandise from one 
place to the other.

It adjoins the concrete block 
building which has been the 
firm ’s home since it was or­
ganized in 1960, and which had 
less than half the floor space 
of the new location.

Construction is pre-fab metal 
measuring 50x100 feet with 
the front 50x30 partitioned off 
for sales, display and office 
space. It has glass across the 
entire front, side walls of

SH Tigers to Get 
New Field House

Plans are now being made 
at Sacred Heart to construct a 
new field house for the Tigers. 
The need for more and better 
facilities has risen from the 
fact that more boys are going 
out for sports.

The building will be on the 
northw est corner of the foot­
ball field and will be 24 ft. by 
24 ft, and capable of accommo­
dating fifty athletes. Showers, 
restrooms, and a store room 
will be included.

The cost is estimated to be 
around $3500. It will be split 
half and half between the Let- 
term an’s Club and the Alumni 
Association over the next three 
years. It is expected to be 
ready for use before the 1973 
football season.

Awards Banquet 
at Sacred Heart 
Scheduled May 19

Coach Dwayne N utt of Aus­
tin College will head the pro­
gram as guest speaker at the 
Sacred Heart All Awards Ban­
quet to be held in the parish 
hall Friday, May 18.

The event will honor stu­
dents who excelled in both ac­
ademics and athletics of the 
past year, w ith awards and 
recognitions being made by 
Sister Mary John Seyler, prin­
cipal, and Bo-b Steele coach.

Charles Bayer of the Sacred 
Heart Alumni will be m aster 
of ceremonies.

Tickets may be purchased 
from Coach Steele.

Early Entry Urged 
For JCs' Enduro 
Motorcycle Races

A tip worth five bucks was 
offered this week by the 
M uenster Jaycees to prospec­
tive entries in the Red River 
Enduro motorcycle races to be 
held near Bulcher on Saturday 
and Sunday, May 19 and 20.

It will cost only $5.00 to en­
ter before May 10 but $10 to 
sign up at the races. The Jay ­
cees, sponsors of the races,' 
point out that a good deal of 
work is involved in getting a 
packet ready for each con­
testant and the bargain entry 
fee is intended as an induce­
m ent to submit names early. 
That would allow 10 days for 
the sponsors to complete re­
cords and prepare packets with 
identifying numbers etc. Con­
testants will sign in and pick 
up their packets on May 19 
and 20.

The races will be held on a 
60 mile track beginning and 
ending a short distance west 
of Bulcher. They will be in 
five classes: under lOOcc, 101- 
175cc, 176-250cc, over 250 and 
powder puff. Riders will meet 
at 7 and the first race will 
start at' 8. Three trophies for 
each class and a sweepstakes 
trophy will be awarded. Ad­
mission charge will be 50 cents 
per person. Concessions will 
be available.

Public Invited to 
Art Show Sunday

The public is invited to a t­
tend, and area artists are wel­
come to exhibit their work in 
Sacred Heart School’s art 
show Sunday, May 6, in the 
high school from 10 a.m. to 
4 p.m. There is no admission 
charge.

Paintings, crafts, needle­
work, handwork and any type 
of art work is welcomed. Ex­
hibitors must have their en­
tries in place by Saturday 
noon.

orange painted metal, torginal 
plastic covered floor w ith 
flakes of white, orange and 
black, wide Formica top coun­
ter and a num ber of display 
racks. The ceiling of acoustical 
tile is topped by insulation in 
addition to the spread of wall 
and rafter insulation through­
out the complete building.

The front section also has 
year round air conditioning, 
and the back has only heating 
for the winter.

The spacious' 35x50 b a c k  
area is more than adequate 
for the stock which was 
crammed into the other build­
ing, and room is left for ex­
pansion. Principal additions 
there are 24 new sections of 
bins and a big A-frame rack 
for V belts.

Formal opening to show off 
the new facilities is in the 
plans but the date still is not 
decided. The most likely time 
is about a month from now.

Pat Hennigan got his s tart 
in business working in t h e  
automotive service owned by 
his father, H. P. Hennigan, in  
the location now occupied by 
Hoedebeck GMC. In 1946 they 
built a sheet m etal building 
one location north of the 
Highway on Maple and moved 
into it. Pat took over the busi­
ness in 1957 when his father 
moved to Albuquerque, N.M., 
and enlarged the building by 
constructing one of concrete 
tile around it and then remov­
ing the old building.

Pat started the automotive 
supply business in August 1960 
and it grew steadily until the 
space w a s  severly cramped. 
Adjoining space on which the 
new building is located was 
bought last fall from Com­
m unity Lum ber Co. and erec­
tion of the pre-fab structure 
started in January.

Hennigan Auto Parts is 
now a family affair with four 
sons . . . Pat Jr., Mike, Tim 
and Tom . . .  as helpers. It 
has also extended its te rri­
tory, delivering twice a week 
to customers in Valley View, 
Sanger and Slidell, and three 
times a week in Saint Jo and 
Forestburg.
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Lippe, Klement 
Go to Austin for 
State Track Meet

Mark Lippe and Lyle Kle­
ment will be among hundreds 
of athletes gathering in Austin 
for state finals in Interscho­
lastic League competition of 
1973. Both of them qualified 
by taking second place in the  
recent regional meet at Step- 
henville. Lippe was in the 
high jum p and Klement in the 
mile run. Earlier both of them  
were first place winners in the 
14-A district meet.

The two MHS Hornets w ill 
be accompanied to Austin by 
Coach Glenn Richardson, who 
said he was highly pleased 
with the Hornet thack record 
this year. The junior division 
team was first and the senior 
division third at the district 
meet. And this is the first time 
that two M uenster boys have 
qualified for the state meet.

Other area athletes advanc­
ing , to state finals are Elvin 

,Dennis of Saint Jo, in the pole 
vault, and Patty  Corcoran of 
Lindsay, in the 440 dash.

Next Tuesday Is , 
Orientation Day 
For SH Beginners

Next Tuesday, May 8, has 
been set as orientation day at 
Sacred Heart School for chil­
dren who will be first graders 
when the fall term opens.

In making that announce­
ment, Sister Georgia, principal, 
said the children’s program 
will begin at 2 p.m. and she 
urges mothers to make every 
effort to have their youngsters 
there. They will be dismissed 
at 3:30.

Afternoon highlights will in­
clude a get-acquainted session 
and activity with first graders.

Children who will be six by 
Septem ber 1 are eligible. Veri­
fication of birth date will be 
needed for those not baptized 
in Sacred Heart Church.

CDAs Meet May 10
M uenster c o u r t  Catholic 

Daughters of America will 
meet next Thursday, May 10. 
in the KC Hall at 8 p.m. P rin ­
cipal business will be election 
of officers.
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Lindsay News
Sunday, May 6, is First 

Communion Day in St. Peter’s 
Parish. Ceremonies will be 
held during the 8 a.m. Mass. 
There are 14 boys and 14 girls 
in the class.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill M artin 
visited his m other Mrs. Zena 
M artin at Hillcrest Manor in 
M uenster Sunday.

Lindsay’s traditional May 
Queen crowning services will 
be held Sunday, May 6, at 7:30

Gasoline, Oil, 
Supplies 

For Your 
Farm  Needs

Jimmy Lehnertz
Gulf Distributor 

665-4562, Gainesville

Or see local dealer 
Ferd's Gulf Station

Greater Fencer
POWER

than ever before!

d f n l e / t M a l u m a f ®

SUPER 98\HD
electric fencer
Super 98 works when 
others cannot because it 
s tarts  out w ith  more 
power than the others. It's 
the most powerful, most 
dependable fencer you 
can buy.
Super-power helps hold 
animals better under a 
variety of conditions.
Come in and see amaz­
ing wood post demon­
stration now!

Community 
Lumber Company

Muenster

p.m. under sponsorship of 
Lindsay CYC. First communi­
cants will escort the crown 
bearer and her court to the 
Blessed Virgin’s altar. Exposi­
tion of the Blessed Sacrament, 
scriptural rosary and Benedic­
tion will follow the coronation 
ceremony.

Mr. and Mrs. Gus Berend 
and children of W indthorst 
spent Easter Monday with 
Lindsay relatives, had dinner 
with the David Huchtons and 
supper with the Jam es Hellin- 
gers.

Bill M artin has accepted gen­
eral chairmanship of Lindsay’s 
annual homecoming picnic to 
be held the last Sunday ip 
June. He will pick two co- 
chairmen and a meeting will 
be called for booth chairmen 
and other helpers to continue 
preparations for the big day.

Announcement has b e e n  
made of the approaching m ar­
riage of Miss Joan Kuhn, 
daughter of Frank Kuhn and 
the late Mrs. Kuhn, and Jim  
Pulte, Gainesville, son of Ed 
Pulte and the late Mrs. Pulte. 
The wedding will take place 
on June 16 in St. Peter’s 
Church.

Mr. and Mrs. Nick Block 
had children and grandchil­
dren with them for an Easter 
get-together, evening meal and 
afternoon egg hunt for the 
youngsters. The Herbie Fleit- 
mans and children of Deni­
son joined the Clem Sand- 
mann family of Lindsay and 
Miss Carolyn Streng of TWU 
and Dennis Lutkenhaus of 
Muenster.

Mr. and Mrs. William Fleit- 
man were Easter hosts with all 
the family present except Miss 
Clara Fleitman of Garden City, 
Mich., and she visited the 
group by telephone. Present 
were the George Krahl family 
of Gainesville, the Ray Linde- 
man family of W indthorst, the 
Curtis Reeves family of Jacks- 
boro and the Henry Fleitman 
family of Lindsay.

Sister Herman Mary Zim- 
m erer has returned to Las 
Cruces, N. M., where she is a 
teacher in Holy Cross School 
after a holiday visit w ith her 
mother Mrs. Herman Zimmer- 
er Sr. and a reunion with the 
family in the home of the Billy 
Zimmerers.

Army Pvt. Jam es Fuhrmann, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Damon 
Fuhrmann, is settled in Heil- 
bronn, Germany and lists his 
address: Fvt. Jam es Fuhrmann, 
459-92-1957; Co. B, 237th Engr. 
Bn., APO New York, N. Y. 
09176.

Highlander Plaid Pickup:

CAROL YOSTEN, salutatorian and MYRON HESS, 
valedictorian at Sacred Heart High School, achieved the 
honors with averages of 93.33 and 94.29, respectively. They 
will receive their medals in graduation exercises on May 
20 in Sacred Heart Church. Parents of the pair are Messrs, 
and Mmes. Henry W. Yosten and A1 Hess.

John Scott Bezner 
And Bride Make 
Home in Virginia

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Bezner 
of Fort W orth honored their 
son John Scott Bezner and his 
bride Barbara Jean at a party 
in their home Saturday night. 
The newly weds had just re­
turned from a Caribbean 
honeymoon. She is the daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Owen.

They were m arried April 21 
in Sharp Chapel on the Uni­
versity of Tulsa campus. W it­
nessing the single ring cere­
mony were Mrs. Leon Cox, sis­
ter of the bride and Steve Bez­
ner, brother of the groom, 
honor attendants, and parents 
immediate family members 
and close friends. Wedding re­
ception was held in the com­
m unity center at Sand Springs, 
Okla.

Area relatives and friends 
at the party  hosted by the 
Ralph Bezners included Messrs, 
and Mmes. Freddie Schmitz, 
Buster Bezner, Bomar Woods, 
Lonnie Woods, Bernard Duf­
fys and Jullie, all of Gaines­
ville.

Also Mrs. Rufus Bezner and 
Messrs, and Mmes William 
Bezner and Hugo Bezner of 
Lindsay, Tommy Zim m erer of 
Grapevine, George Rohleder,

Chuck Rossmussen, B. W. 
Pavlick, Billy Reid, Jim  Bass, 
and Jim m y Davies and Chris, 
and Rick Bezner, all of Fort 
Worth, Buzz Bezner of Arling­
ton, Don Woods of Dallas, 
Steve and Will Bezner of Hurst 
and the hosts’ other children 
Russell, LeAnn, Lorie and 
Gary Bezner.

John Scott Bezner received 
his Bachelor degree in m echan­
ical engineering from the Uni­
versity of Texas at Arlington 
and his M aster’s from Texas 
A&M University. He is em­
ployed as operations research 
analyst for the U. S. Govern­
m ent in Petersburg, Va., where 
the couple will make their 
home. He is a grandson of Mrs. 
John House of Era and the 
late Mr. and Mrs. John Bez­
ner of Lindsay.

Excellent Food 

Properly Served

The CURTWOOD 
RESTAURANT

Em metl Curtis 
Gainesville, Texas

4th Graders Get 
Field Trip, Talk 
On Electricity

Fourth graders at M uenster 
Public School had two sessions 
on the fundam entals of elec­
tricity W ednesday and Friday 
of last. week.

The first was a field trip  to 
the p lant fac ilitie s  of TP&L 
at Gainesville last W ednejday 
accompanied by Ernest Jaska.

P lan t personnel conducted 
them on a tour explaining how 
the current is generated and 
conducted through power lines 
to the customers. They were 
treated to refreshm ents before 
leaving the plant. And since 
than they have been doing 
drawings in a rt class based on 
the trip.

The second session was a 
visit to the classroom by K en­
neth Selby, TP&L lineman. He 
explained his job and demon­
strated  his equipment, partic­
ularly its safety features. He 
stressed that a person m ust al­
ways be careful w ith electric­
ity, also suggested that the 
children check extension cords 
and report frayed or defective 
ones to their parents. He fu r­
ther warned not to overload 
outlets or substitute a penny 
for a fuse.

Mr. Selby ended his program 
outside w ith  a dem onstration 
on pole climbing.

Honor Society Pins
Members of the M uenster 

chapter of the National Honor 
Society received their m em ­
bership pins last week W ed­
nesday night in their regular 
m onthly meeting. P resenta­
tions were m ade by Gary 
Chisam, chapter advisor.

Kent Bellah Studio 
Saint Jo

Open 10 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Closed Sun., Mon., Tues.

About seven per cent of the 
Florida production of citrus 
juices is sold in W estern Eu­
rope, compared to one-half of 
one per cent only five years 
ago.

Noah Webster, who pub­
lished his first dictionary in 
1806, was born in West H art­
ford, Conn., in a house which 
is now a National Historical 
Landmark.

EFFECTIVE MAY 1st
our prices will be increased.
This is necessary because of 
the increased cost of supplies.

Evelyn’s Styleroom 
Angie’s Beauty Shop 
Carol’s Beauty Salon

Leo Henscheid

INSURANCE
Auto, Fire, Liability 

Ph. 759-2844

Mother 
Will Love 
a Pair of 

Good Shoes
from

Fanai's Shoe Store
in Gainesville

n o r
forgfacts®

H A M R I C ’S
Men's and Boys' Wear 

Muenster, Texas

On May 9 Lindsay seniors 
will have their one-day outing. 
Plans are to go to Dallas, tour 
some shopping centers and a t­
tend a dinner theatre at night. 
Graduation is set for May 25.

Selected optional equipment 
special plaid interiors ,

Standard Vz & % ton Fleetsides

Save up to $225.00
off retail price

Several to choose from.

WI L D E

I
STEEL GLIDER

Two passenger glider just right for your patio

Colors: Green & Pumpkin

H P  J ^  l  -  >  
1 /

Model No. 051 $ 15 .8 8  ea.
Matching Steel Chair

Green & Pumpkin

Model No. 049 $ 5.88  ea.

200 N. Denison, Gainesville

General Electric

Pocket Radio
The perfect pocket radio for anyone 
on the go. High-impact case, fine 
sound and the battery saver circuit 
give extra quality at a value price.

Model No. 2790

Limit 1 $ 3 . 8 8  ea.

Dimple Goblet
Beautiful 17-oz. Iced Tea glasses 

great for entertaining. Sturdy 
Enough fo Everyday Use,

4  for $ 1.00
■ M B n n n H V B M B M M B H i

Prices good through May 5th.
/

We reserve the right to limit quantities.
«  "•* V • ■>■; '*L. -v

.. ‘ .i«p i ■

■v
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If you th ink you have in­

fluence, try  ordering someone 
else’s dog around.

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTING

Fixtures
Supplles

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 
Installations, Repairs. 

Appliance Repairs.

Call 665-2721
Nights call 

665-3263 or 665-4456

Parker Electric
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville

25th Anniversary 
Is Celebrated by 
Mr., Mrs. Joe Hess

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hess have 
reached a silver milestone and 
have celebrated their 25th 
wedding anniversary.

Festivities began with Mass 
in Sacred H eart Church and 
concluded with a reception in 
the VFW Hall.

The Rev. William Botik of 
Fort Worth who m arried the 
couple April 14, 1948, con- 
celebrated the anniversary 
Mass w ith  the Rev. Jerry  Mos- 
man of Fort Worth. Wedding 
vows in a double ring cere­
mony were renewed. Mrs. Hess 
is the form er Miss Beatrice 
Rauschuber of Valley View.

Mass servers were the sil- 
verweds’ two sons Charles 
and Kevin Hess, and Garry 
Fetsch.

A ttendants 25 years ago 
were t h e  bride's sister Miss 
Trudy Rauschuber, now Mrs. 
Vincent Felderhoff, a n d  the 
groom’s brother Tony Hess. 
They were attendants again.

Nieces and nephews of the 
honorees presented the offer­
tory gifts. Nickie Hess carried 
the anniversary candle, Bren­

da Felderhoff carried a r e d
rose, Donnie and Jerry  Raus­
chuber carried the w ater and 
wine and Rosina and Linda 
Schmidlkofer carried the paten 
and ciborium

Sammy Hess a n d  Brenda 
Felderhoff g a v e  scripture 
readings.

Sister of the 25ryear groom, 
Sister Joan Hess of Benton, 
Ark., was organist and Sister 
Yvonne Lerner w a s  vocal 
soloist.

A fter church services a re­
ception was held in the VFW 
Hall where Mrs. Vincent Fel­
derhoff and Mrs. Tony Hess 
registered about 120 guests.

The tiered anniversary cake 
was adorned w ith figurines 
representing the couple’s three 
sons. Their eldest, George, 
failed to survive open heart 
surgeiy.

Also on the table was a 
decorated b i r t h d a y  cake 
topped with the figurine of a 
priest for Father Botik’s b irth ­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Hess live on 
the same farm  they moved to 
after their marriage. They al­
so are dairy farmers.

Guests included Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Fitch and children

of Dallas, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Noyes and daughter of Rich­
ardson, Mr. and Mrs. Orlando 
Bonfiglio of Plano, Miss Em­
ma Fisher of Fort Worth, and 
others from Valley View, 
Gainesville, L i n d s a y  and 
Muenster.

SH High to Have 
Banquet and Prom 
Saturday Night

Annual Sacred H eart High 
Junior-Senior Banquet and 
Prom will be held Saturday 
night this week beginning at 
7 o’clock in the KC Hall.

On entering the decorated 
banquet room, each senior will 
be introduced as a guest of 
honor. After the meal, junior 
students will recall events that 
have occurred in the lives of 
the seniors and seniors in turn  
will present their last will and 
testament.

Cherry Rhone will be music 
makers for dancing.

The two classes will be 
joined for festivities by par­
ents and SHH faculty mem­
bers.

Buy, sell, ren t with 
Enterprise W ant Ads.

the

8 pack carton

All Soft Drinks _ _ - -59c
Case of bottles

Old Milwaukee Beer _ _ $3.69
Case of cans

Budweiser Beer _

Food King qt.

Hunt's No. 300 can

Phone 759-4434

H O FB  A U E R ’S
FOOD & LOCKER SERVICE

Reg. $1.59 Family Size

Right Guard 
Deodorant 
7 oz. 99c

Reg. 74c

Bayer Aspirin
. 50,49c

Reg. $1.15 
Head &  Shoulders

Shampoo 
2.5 oz. 69c

Reg. 85c Listerine

Antiseptic 
7 oz, 59c

COURTESY
SERVICE

PRICE
QUALITY

_ $4.89

Salad Dressing _ _ _ _ 39c

Fruit Cocktail _ _ _ 3 - $1.00
Del Monte 20 oz.

Catsup _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _  37c
Kraft pt.

Mayonnaise _ _ _ .. _ 39c
Del Monte No. 303 can

Corn w.k. _ _ _ _ . 4 - 79c
Shurfine 20 qt. size Non Fat

Instant Dry Milk _ _ _ $2.34
Shurfine 10 oz. bag

Potato Chips _ _ _ _ 49c
Best Maid qt.

Sour or Dill Pickles _ _ _ 49c
Food King 3 lb. can

Shortening _ _ _ _ _ _  58c
French 24 oz. jar

Mustard _ 43c
Del Monte No. 303 can

Cut Green Beans _ 3 - 79c

. 6 - $ 1 . 0 0

_ 4 - $ 1 . 0 0

Tomatoes, 10 oz.
Irish Spring bath size

Deodorant Soap
6 menus

Hamburger Helper _ .. ea. 54c
6 menus Carnation

Spreadables _ _ _ _ _  59c
Kraft Parkay 1 lb. pkg.

Margarine _ _ _ .. 3 - $1.00
Chef's Delight 2 lb.

Cheese Spread .
Reg. 89c, 49 oz. box

Bold Detergent _ _ _ _ 78c
Royal Arms 4 roll pkg.

Toilet Tissue _ _ _ 3 - $1.00

WE
GIVE

Double Stamps 
on Wednesday
With grocery purchcuG 

of $5.G0 or more (no 
cigarettes) on Wednesday 
we give twice as many 

S<SH Green Stamps

M eats
Chuck Roast _ _ _ _ _ _ lb. 79c 

Arm Roast _ _ _ _ _ _  _ lb. 85c

_____ 79c

Boneless

Stew Meat _ _ _ .. _ _ lb. $1.09 

Seven Steak _ _ _ _ _ _ lb. 85c 

Bulk Franks _ _ _ _ _ _ lb. 79c

Frozen
Pepperidge Farms cherry, peach, apple, blueberry

Turnovers, 12 oz. _ .. _ .. _ 49c
Shurfine 9 oz. Fordhook

Lima Beans _ _ _ _ _ 4 - $1.00 

Parkerbouse Rolls 28 oz. _ _ _ 39c

Produce
BANANAS__________ .lb .  7c

with $5.00 purchase, limit 5 lb.

Radishes _ _ _ _ _ _  pkg. 10c

Tomatoes _ _ _ _ _ _ _  lb. 29c
Purple Top

Turnips _ . _ _ _ _ _ „ . lb. 29c
Fancy Valencia

Grapes _ _ _ _ _ _ _ .. lb. 27c

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Pels a t­
tended funeral services Sat­
urday afternoon for her grand­
father, Newt Carpenter, 60, 
at Sulphur Springs and b u r­
ial at Como Cemetery. He died 
Thursday.

Junior class students of 
MHS, - accompanied by Mrs. 
Irene Hartman, visited CCJC 
Library Tuesday afternoon to 
acquire m aterial f o r  an as­
signed research paper in Eng 
lish III.

Clara Streng to 
Marry on July 7 
In Ft. Worth Rite

Mr. and Mrs. John Streng 
announce the engagement and 
approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Miss Clara Streng, 
and G. Horace Brown of Fort 
Worth, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
George Brown of that city.

Wedding plans are being 
made for July 7 in St. An­
drew’s Catholic Church in Fort 
Worth at 3 p.m.

Miss Streng is a graduate 
of Sacred Heart High School 
and was employed in the busi­
ness office of M uenster Hos­
pital before going to Fort 
W orth to be employed as an 
accounting clerk.

The future groom is a grad­
uate of Texas Christian Uni­
versity and is employed in 
Fort Worth where they will 
make their home. He is an ac­
countant.

Lillian Vogel Is 
Honoree at Party

Miss Lillian Vogel, bride- 
elect of Wilfred W alterscheid, 
was honored with a personal 
gift shower Friday evening in 
the home of Mrs. Laraine Mit­
chell of Fort Worth. On a rri­
val she received an orchid 
corsage from the hostess.

Guests helped themselves 
from a  buffet of finger foods 
including fancy sandwiches, 
cheese sticks, shrimp, olives, 
nuts and fancy cookies.

Beautifully wrapped gifts 
which were later opened 
adorned a huge fireplace. Mrs. 
Danny Hoenig, sister of the 
honoree, from Denton and 
Mrs. Louise Davidson of Fort 
Worth assisted in opening the 
gifts which included a beauti­
ful “Wedding Candle” from 
the hostess.

Mrs. Joe Vogel, m other of 
the honor guest, Mrs. Weldon 
Vogel and Mrs. Leo Hess of 
M uenster were among about 
30 guests from Gainesville, 
Denton, Fort W orth and Dallas.

Miss Vogel, long-time em ­
ployee of Riverside State 
Bank in Fort Worth, was re 
cently made assistant vice 
president of the bank. She will 
be married to Mr. W alterscheid 
on May 19 in Sacred Heart 
Church and the couple will 
live in Muenster.

OPENING TUESDAY, MAY 8

Carolyn's Craft Shop
N. Ash Street, Muenster, Ph. 759-2726

Formal Opening to be announced

Materials and Sewing Needs
Coordinate Knits

TERRY CLOTH for beachwectr
Patterns and Accessories

The Fabric Center
Dorma Flusche, 759-4401, Muenster

Open 9 to 5, 6 days a  week

Dairy Inn Specials
Tues., Wed., Thurs., May 8-9-10

Reg. 70c
Barbecue Sandwich ______  59c
Reg. 30c
Large Drink______________  19c

Special Any Time
Notice your cash register slip. If it has a  red 
star you are entitled to a  free hamburger.

O P E N :
9 a.m. to 11 p.m. Sunday thru Thursday 

9 a.m. to midnight Friday &  Saturday

The Dairy Inn
Muenster

L A -Z -B O Y FOR FATHER'S DAY
Reclina-Rocker La-Z-Boy tailors great gifting for the great guy — Dad. 

If your Dad is extra tall, La-Z-Boy goes to great 
lengths to give him extra inches to stretch out tip-to- 
toe. The same style as our regular Reclina-Rocker 
chairs — but larger.
He leans back to any angle — from TV viewing to 
full-length recline. And, because this is a Reclina- 
Rocker, he gets an extra comfort bonus when he 
uses his Father’s Day gift as a rocker.
Now's the time to get the extra special gift for that 
extra tall guy that’s so special. Come in now for im­
mediate delivery.

Newland Furniture Co.
2005 E. Highway 82, Gainesville
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Attend Baptism in 
Grapevine Sunday

Christening service for in­
fan t William Robert Zimmer- 
er, son of Mr. and Mis. Tom­
my Zimmerer, was held Sun­
day at 2 p.m. in St. Francis 
Church at Grapevine.

Attending as godparents for 
their nephew were Mr. and 
Mrs. Alfred Hess of Gaines­
ville. Others present were the 
parents, grandparents Mr s .  
William Neu of Gainesville 
and Mr. and Mrs. Bruno Zim-

Model AS181M2K

Westlnghouse Window 
Air Conditioner
•  18,000 BTU cooling capacity
•  Infinite position thermostat
•  2-speed fan, High and Night Cool
•  Adjustable air directional louvers

Westinghouse
You can be s u r e .. .If  It's

Nationwide

Muenster 
Butane Co.

m erer of Lindsay, the Hess 
children Douglas, Rhonda and 
the baby’s sister Tonia.

Afterward they were to­
gether at the Zim m erer home 
for a christening supRer.

Others stopping in to get ac­
quainted with the new baby 
were Mr. and Mrs. Paul Zim­
m erer of Leonia, N. J., Sister 
Dorothy Theiesa Zimm erer of 
Ennis and Ralph Bezner of 
Fort Worth.

The Zimmerers arrived last 
Wednesday to spend about 
two days with his father, I. A. 
Zimmerer and family m em ­
bers. Sister Dorothy Theresa 
spent the weekend. They were 
returning her to Ennis.

4-H Club 
News

4-H Club Meeting
M uenster Community 4-H 

Club will meet next Thursday, 
May 10, in TP&L community 
room at 7:30. Principal busi­
ness will be election of offic­
ers. Parents and family m em ­
bers are invited to attend 
with their 4-H’ers.

Lloyd Reiter President
Lloyd Reiter is president of 

the Sacred H eart 7th and 8th 
Grade 4-PI B03 s Club for the 
coming school year. He was 
elected at a m eeting W ednes­
day presided by Billy Felder- 
hoff and attended by Assist­
ant County Agent Craig Ros­
enbaum.

Other officers are Dale 
Wolf, vice-president; Robert 
Hartman, secretary; Bernie 
Fette, reporter; Danny Wal- 
terscheid, council delegate.

Members discussed the cor­
rect way to put together a 
4-H record book and planned 
a pet show for the coming 
weekend.

Mrs. Jack Janicki and Mrs. 
Hal Falck of San Antonio are 
here this week visiting their 
parents, the Jake Pagels.

gl/ts/^graduate
A great selection for 

elementary, junior high, 
high school or college
We have gift certificates, if you 

are undecided.
$ S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S 3 S 33 S S S S S S S S S ^

Big S a le
Thurs., Fri., Sat. . . . May 3, 4, 5, 

Free Cokes and Dr. Pepper
Saturday only

i3 & ss& ess& esses2 ss& ssee& s& es& s&

Richard’s Jeans
301 E. California, Gainesville

Open 11 to 7, Monday thru Friday 
10 to 6, Saturday

TASTE-TEMPTING

Chuck or seven roast __  lb. 77c
Arm Roast _________  lb. 87c
Ground B eef___________ lb. 79c
Beef Liver ____ *______ lb. 49c
Decker Slab Bacon 2-lb. ..$1.59
H & W Sausage 2-lb. bag .... $1.59

iS S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S e

Custom Killing Service 
complete processing 

cut, double wrapped & frozen

We specialize in sales of half or whole 
beef and custom processing. Double wrapping, 
paper between steaks, and solid freezing are 
all a  part of our service. Tenderizing, ham­
burger patties, and special cuts of any kind 
Si desired.

We Close Saturday at Noon

H&W Meat Co
Muenster. 759-2744

B I R T H S

Mr. a n d  Mrs. Joe David 
Bayer of Denton, happy first­
time parents, announce a son, 
six pounds seven ounces, born 
Tuesday morning, May 1. 
They’ve named him Aaron 
Matthew. Mr. and Mrs. Alfred 
Bayer are proud first-tim e 
grandparents and Mrs. G er­
trude Bayer is great-grand­
m other for the first time. The 
m aternal grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. L. V. Hagan of 
Baird.

Mr. and Mrs. Leonard En- 
dres have welcomed a new 
grandchild, Rebecca D a w n  
Hertach, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry  Hertach of Kansas 
City, Kansas, born Friday, 
April 27, 1:27 a.m. She’s an 
eight pound two ounce sister 
for Jennifer. Mrs. Hertach is 
the form er Miss Mary Endres.

Telephoned birth announce­
ment to Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Fetsch informed t h e m  they 
are grandparents again. The 
newcomer, born Wednesday, 
April 25, is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Noyes of Richardson. 
He’s a six pound half ounce 
brother for Jennifer. Paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Emerson Noyes of Dallas and 
there are Great-grandm others 
Noyes of Miami Beach, Fla., 
and Jordan of Oklahoma City.

Ir. Honor Society 
Takes Orders for 
Mother Day Cakes

A bake sale for the day be­
fore M other’s Day was planned 
last week Wednesday by the 
Junion Honor Society at its 
regular meeting. A special fea­
ture of it is acceptance of 
special orders for M other’s Day 
cakes. Those orders may be 
phoned through Thursday, the 
10th, to Charlotte Johnson, 
759-4215; Debbie Reynolds, 759- 
2815; and Mrs. Eddie Fleitman, 
759-2773.

Also at the meeting a report 
was given on an art show 
sponsored by the chapter on 
April 15. Exhibitors were Bev­
erly Trubenbach, Julie  Bright, 
Jam es Bright, Charlotte F leit­
man, Connie Flusche, Bridget 
Jaska and Alexa Jaska in the 
junior departm ent. Also Lola 
Bright, Lou Ann Swirczynski 
an M ary Lou Fleitman.

Shop Students See 
Furniture Factory

Industrial Arts students of 
M uenster High saw how church 
furniture is made Monday af­
ternoon on a field trip to San­
ders Furniture Company of 
Gainesville.

The principal operation there 
was the m anufacture of veneer 
covered furniture, and saw a 
num ber of machines not found 
in school or home workshops. 
Some of those were a glue 
spreader, v e n e e r  cutter, 
straight line double edge rip 
saw and a veneer hot press 
using both steam and radio 
waves for drying glue.

Students were surprised to 
learn tha t much of today’s 
church furniture is padded and 
upholstered

72 Texas Traffic 
Kills 3,688 and 
Injures 128,158

Colonel Wilson E. Speir, di­
rector of the Texas D epart­
ment o f Public Safety, an ­
nounced today that a record 
3,688 persons died last year in 
3,099 fatal traffic crashes on 
the streets and highways of 
Texas. Another 128,158 persons 
were injured in 83,607 injury 
accidents.

Rural areas led in traffic 
deaths, but city crashes pro­
duced the greatest num ber of 
reported injuries.

Of the deaths, 1,409 were in 
cities and 2,279 in rural areas. 
Some 94,855 of the injuries 
were in ru ral crashes.

Overall, a total of 432,998 
traffic accidents were reported 
last year in the state. Re­
ported accidents increased 10 
percent from the 394,166 oc­
curring in 1971.

The total economic loss to 
Texans from traffic accidents 
during 1972 was $l-billion, 35- 
million. ($1,035,000,000)

Speir observed that almost 
76.7-billion vehicle miles were 
driven in Texas last year — an 
eight per cent increase from 
1971.

On a positive note, the DPS 
director pointed out that due 
to the fact vehicle miles in­
creased faster than fatalities, 
the traffic death rate per 100- 
million vehicle miles decreased 
from 5.1 in 1971 to 4.8 in 1972.

Speir observed that a death 
rate as low as 4.8 has been 
achieved in Texas only one 
other tim e (in 1961) since the 
DPS began making such cal­
culations in 1937. It was 6.2 in 
1966, 14.6 in 1937.

“To keep friends always, 
give your candied opinion.”

HEADING MOSAICS STAFF at SHH School for 
1973-74 will be Cheryl Bayer (left) and Beverly W alter- 
scheid, co-editors, and Phil Endres (left) and Jeff Fette, 
associate editors, as announced by Brother Thomas Mos­
her, journalism advisor. These journalists will be publish­
ing Volume 22 of the school paper.

Traci Jones Has 
First Celebration

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Jones 
of Gainesville were hosts Tues­
day night in their home enter­
taining with a cake and ice 
cream party for their daugh­
ter Traci who was one year 
old. She was showered with 
gifts.

Guests were her godparents 
Joe Miller of Gainesville and 
Miss Janie Zimmerer of Lind­
say, grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruno Zimm erer and great­
grandm other Mrs Joe Bezner

Sr., Mr. and Mrs. Jim m y Zim­
m erer Jeff and Jennifer and 
Bobby, Dona and Sammy Zim­
merer, all of Lindsay; Miss 
CaroL Felderhoff and Mrs. 
Eoyce Morgan, Darrin, Debra 
and Jeff of Gainesville.

Mass will be celebrated at 
Hillcrest Manor by Father 
Bede Friday night at 7 o’clock. 
Relatives and friends of pati­
ents are invited to attend.

A person with a handicap 
often overcomes it by being 
superior in another way.

FOR GOOD, LOW COST
FIRE and STORM 

INSURANCE
Contact

Muenster Mutual 
Fire Insurance Association

Edward Endres, Secretary, 759-2905, Box 37, Muenster

ANYWHERE

Treat the Family Right
Dinner here is a treat to the children 
and a  rest for Mom. Enjoy the home 
cooked goodness of our food and our 
delightful atmosphere.

CLOSED EVERY TUESDAY

ROHMER'S
RESTAURANT

Muenster

Y ou r
Chrysler-Plymouth 

Dealer has a new  
game plan

c a lle d ...
WINNING 

YOU
A f / v i D  m

CHRYSLER

with the right choice of cars 
at the right price, 
backed by the right attitude.

AUTHORIZED DEALER CHRYSLER
MOTORS CORPORATOR

Chrysler Newport 4-Dr. Hardtop

**Your Chrysler-PIymouth Dealer has asked me, 
Darrell Royal, to tell you about his big new game 

plan to win you over. He knows you want a good, 
well-built car. He knows you want good service, fair 

prices and a friendly attitude*. That’s his plan to 
win you over. Ho also has the right choice of cars 

to do it with. Like the Plymouth Duster, Plymouth 
Satellite, the popular Plymouth Fury and the

big beautiful Chrysler. But find out for yourselL 
Why don’t you spend a few minutes with 
your Chrysler-PIymouth Dealer.*’

It's a
whole new  
ball game!

TUGGLE MOTOR COMPANY, 108 N. Main, Muenster
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CLASSIFIED AD RATES 
F irs t in sertio n  20 cen ts  per line. 

M inim um  $1.00
Follow ing in se rtio n  10 cen ts  per 
line . M inim um  50 cents.

DISPLAY CLASSIFIED
„  p e r col. In. $1.25
__  per col. In. 75c
IN BORDER 

_  p e r col. in. $1.50
S tand ing  a d ___7_ p er col. in. $1.00

C ard of T hanks $1.00 
LEGAL NOTICE RATES 

F irst In sertion  2 cen ts  p e r w ord. 
Follow ing Insertion  1 cen t p e r 
w ord .

F irs t In se rtio n
S tand ing  A d __

DISPLAY 
F irs t in sertion

THANKS
Many thanks to many friends 

•who rem embered me with 
cards and prayers while I was 
a patient at St. Paul’s Hospital. 
Special thanks to Father Bede.

— Ola Roberg

LOST & FOUND
FOUND: Man’s wrist watch, 

759-2541

FOUND: Wedding Ring Set. 
Identify and pay this ad at 
the Enterprise.

LOST: Black & white Eng­
lish Setter and Lemon Pointer. 
See or call Virgil Henscheid.

24p

LOST: Girl’s white gold 
w rist watch during paper 
drive Saturday. Sentim ental 
value. Ph. 759-2552. Reward.

24-1

FOR SALE
1971 LTD For Sale

2-door hardtop, automatic, air 
C. O. Cash, 226 Sycamore 

Call 759-4105 after 4 p.m. 24-1
YARD SALE

Fri., & Sat. Shrubs, pot 
plants, name it. At Mrs. Joe 
W. Brown’s, Leo Community, 
768-2760. 24-1

Concord tires for auto, 
truck & tractor. Check 
our prices. R&M Auto 
Service.

Albert & Bob 24ft

For Home Delivery of 
Fort Worth S tar Telegram 
or Dallas Morning News 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828, Bx. 546, Sanger 16tf

We offer the best

Veterinary 

Supplies and 
Instruments

Now, more than ever, 
it  pays to keep your 
livestock, healthy.

Let W atts Bros, be 
your first stop for 

Veterinarian-Approved 
drugs and instrum ents.

Watts Bros. 
Pharmacy

Gainesville

FOR SALE: Fleetwood Mo­
bile Home, 12x60 feet, 2 bed­
rooms. Ph. 759-4574 after 6 
p.m. Don Fisher. 23-4p

TANKS. Septic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks, w ater tanks. 
Will install. Bayer concrete. 
Phone 759-4244. M uenster
CONCRETE WORK: Any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish 
ready mix concrete. Bayer 
Concrete. 28tf

WRANGLERS
Shoes — Boots

Work - Dress - Western
Nocona Boots 
J. R. Hocker

Men's & Boy*' Store
207 N. Commerce. Gainesville

Good
Replacement

Cattle
Approxim ately 30 young 
stock cows and calves, 
all from one farm, will be 
sold at our sale on

Thurs., May 10
Muenster
Livestock
Auction

We stock needles for all 
m ajor brands of stereos. Wood’s 
Furniture Center.
N. Int. 35 Gainesville

23-5

'GLASS: Plate, window, auto­
mobile, furniture tops, mirrors. 
Complete glass service. We 
h a n d l e  insurance claims. 
Gainesville Glass Shop. 665- 
3321, 311 N. Chestnut. 37tf

PRE FINISHED 
P A N E L I N G

in stock at
Community Lum ber Co.

FOR SALE: six-room frame 
house to be moved. Bids ac­
cepted until June 15. Reserve 
right to reject any or all bids. 
Mail bids to Mrs. M agdalene 
Lewis, Rt. 2, M uenster, 76252.

21-tf

FOR SALE: In good condi­
tion, Electric Super Simplex 
ironer, 48-in. roller. Phone 759- 
2823. 17-tf

Call
Dan Luke 
759-2522

FOR

BUTANE 
PROPANE 
FINA GAS 
FINA OIL

FINE DIAMONDS 
WATCHES, JEWELRY 

WATCH REPAIR

KOESLER JEWELRY 
M uenster

Water Pumps
Submersible 

Vb H.P to 40 H.P.

Plastic Pipe
A very inexpensive 

way to get water 
where you need it.

C. D. Shamburger 
Lumber Co.

M uenster

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies

Structural Steel 
and Pipe

Metal Sales, Inc.
On Highway 82 

west of Gainesville

FOR
MARY KAY NEEDS

CALL JAN CAIN 
Free Facials

Phone 759-4331 
Res. No. 759-2746

MOTORS, all sizes, for milk­
ing machines, w ater pumps, 
oil field equipment, etc. C. D. 
Sham burger Lum ber Co. 43tf

Custom
Picture Framing 

and Matting
Newland 

Furniture Co.
Gainesville 25tf

SHAG
100% Nylon 

Completely Installed

$7.50 sq. yd.
Specials on 
Roll Ends

Indoor-Outdoor
Carpet

Linoleum, 
Vinyl, Tile

Dale's
Carpet Shop
Dale & Pat M artin 

and Don Bezner 
665-2208, Gainesville

Royal Magnetic Signs

Advertise as you park or ride.
Signs of special outdoor 

Plastic in color

See Our Samples

MUENSTER ENTERPRISE

Stereos, Tapes 
Records 

Accessories
Every Day Low Prices 

8 track T a p e s ___ $2.99

Don’s
Record Rack

203 E. California 
Gainesville, 665-9174

Hudgins 
Sewing Circle
309 E. Calif.. 665-2542

Gainesville
SALES AND SERVICE 

on all makes of 
sewing machines and 

vacuum cleaners.

Ornamental
Iron

Increase the value and 
beauty of your home 
w ith our custom built 
decorative iron.
For free estimates call 

DALE LLOYD'S 
WELDING SERVICE 
665-6682, E. Hwy. 82 

Gainesville 16-8p

Grain Bins
Columbian & Reed-Joseph 

1000 bu. 1350 bu.
2200 bu. 2750 bu

3300 bu.
in stock now 

and priced right

Wil-O-Mac
Gainesville

REAL ESTATE

Special Notice
For a cake with 
the personal touch

Call Betty 
759-4143

All Occasion 
Cakes

Wedding, birthday, 
graduation, or any 
special celebration

Remember Mother 
on her day, May 13

Place orders now with 
Mrs. Jerry  W alterscheid

759-4143 24-1

WANTED
400 to 1000 acres within 12 

miles of Muenster. A1 Testa, 
Rt. 1, 121 E. Sanger. Ph. 817- 
458-3580, or after noon 759- 
4121, Muenster. 24-tf

Building Lots
for sale

H arry Otto, 219 S. Pine
M uenster 23-tf

House for Sale
Two bedrooms, new panel­

ing and storm windows, as­
bestos siding. 222 Second St. 
Ph. 759-4345 after 5 p.m. 13-tf

SERVICE
We have the most m odem  

front end equipment. Try us. 
Wilde Chevrolet. 24-2

Lawn Mower 
Sharpening &  Repair 
Shaft Straightening 

General Motor Overhaul
Dick Dittfurth, 759-4154

21-1 Op

CLEANING and Pressing. 
We pick up and deliver. Shoe 
Repairing. Nick and Adelina 
Miller, Ph. 759-4422. Muenster.

CARPET 
\ TILE

VINYL FLOORING 
EXPERT INSTALLATION

Modem Floors
Muenster, Texas 
Phone 759-4350 

Roy Monday, owner
14tf

FOR RENT
MOBILE HOME for rent. 2 

bedroom, fully furnished, a 
block from school on N. Wal­
nut. Ph. 759-2268, Jerom e Pa- 
gel. 16-tf

WANTED

Westinghouse 
Appliances 

& Zenith TVs
Sales and Service

Radio & TV Repair 
Muenster Butane

Ph. 759-4411

Responsible person to take 
over payments on Kirby Vac­
uum Cleaner and A ttachm ents 
— low balance $9.81 monthly. 
Kirby Co. 835 E. Calif., Gaines­
ville, 665-9812. 24-3

Wanted:
Building 

Maintenance 
& Custodian

Full time employment
COOKE COUNTY 

ELECTRIC CO-OP.
E. Hwy. 82, M uenster

Equal Opporunity 
Employer

WANTED
man for cleanup and 
general m aintenance 

also
lady for office and 

clerical work

Apply at

Wilde Chevrolet
M uenster 27-tf

WANTED:
Rod Machine Operator

Must be experienced_
GREWING BROTHERS 22tf

Deep Steam 
Carpet 

Cleaning
Newland 

Furniture Co.
2005 E. Hwy. 82 

Phone 665-2461 
Gainesville

CERAMIC TILE. New and 
old installation. For estimate 
call Ted Henscheid, 759-4280, 
Muenster. 5tf

Complete Auto Serv­
ice, Spin type wheel 
balance, front end align­
ment, air conditioning 
service & tune-up at 
R&M Auto.' Bob W alter­
scheid. 24tf

Dozer & Grader 
Service

Roads and Terraces

J. H. Bayer
Muenster. 759-2924 13tf

Buy your
ELECTRIC
MOTORS

W here they can be 
Serviced.

All sizes sold 
and repaired.

Motors for 
Water Wells & 
Air-conditioners

Oil Field Wiring 
Service Calls

UNITED
ELECTRIC SERVICE

CHRIS MULLER 
East Hy* 82, Muenster 

817-759-4517
21-tf

Jh Utt* Gfa* &P •

STOW IT! 
DON'T THROW IT!

TEXAS HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

MUENSTER MILLING CO.
“M-M” QUALITY FEEDS

DEPENDABLE GRINDING & MIXING

Feed - Seed - Grain 
Fertilizer - Insecticides

Bulk Feed Service
PHONE 759-2287

ELECTRICAL 
INSTALLATIONS 

& REPAIRS
Including Heating 

and Air Conditioning 
Residential & Commercial

GRIGGS ELECTRIC
Day ph. 759-2232 

Nite ph. 768-2759
34-tf

You Bend 'Em 
WE'LL 

MEND 'EM
Car rebuilding 

8c painting
W indshields, Door glass

FREE ESTIMATES

AL H O R N
5th & Cedar, 759-4471 

30tf

ELECTRIC
WORK

Electric Motors
Any size -

Muenster Electric
Sales <& Service

21-tf

Dozer Service
Call or See

Frank Hess
759-4249

Use of Pesticides 
Now Governed by 
Firm Set of Rules

Sum mer is coming and so 
are the insects — a plaque to 
farm ers and housewives alike.

This year it is more im port­
ant than ever to read the di­
rections on the container be­
fore spraying that rosebush 
or dusting that cotton field, 
A g r i c u l t u r e  Commission­
er W hite explained. “The Fed­
eral Environm ental Pesticide 
Control Act of 1972 set out 
some firm  rules on how pesti­
cides can be used in  insect 
control. The rules are printed 
on the product label and any 
use of the pesticide other than 
that indicated is a violation of 
this federal law.’’

The printed directions are 
for the protection of both the 
user and the environment, 
Commissioner White noted. 
Many products are very spec­
ialized in what they will or 
will not do. And the misuse 
of insecticides ofter can be 
harmful.

‘‘It just makes sense to read 
and follow directions,” he 
added.

Farm ers are especially urged 
to check the product labels 
this season. Pesticides repre­
sent a big investment to the 
grower. He should get his 
money’s worth by making cer­
tain he uses the proper pro­
duct at the right time in the 
most effective manner.

“Beware of misleading state­
ments in newspaper advertise­
ments,” the Commissioner em-
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Local Group on 
Hawaiian Holiday 
Shook by Quake

All the natural beauty and 
entertainm ent offered tourists 
in Hawaii was on the itinerary 
of a M uenster group but the 
earthquake they experienced 
April 26 at Hilo is their chief 
topic of conversation.

Mmes. Richard Grewing, 
Ruth Needham, Ray Evans, 
Ervin Hamric and M. H. King 
were in Hilo when the quake 
hit and it was a shaking exper­
ience. Mrs. Jerom e Pagel and 
Mrs. Leo J. Haverkamp, the 
other members of the local 
group, were in Honolulu at 
the time and the former felt 
a slight trem or but the latter 
was not aware anything was 
happening, they reported.

Mrs. Needham, on the sev­
enth floor of the hotel, ran 
down all the flights to safety 
and escaped a flood of water 
pouring from the eighth floor 
where w ater lines had broken. 
Mrs. Grewing, on the fourth 
floor, had no problem getting 
downstairs.

Mmes. Hamric, Evans and 
King were exploring a shop­
ping center w hen the earth 
started waving and Mmes. 
H am ric1 and Evans scrambled 
under furniture with other 
shoppers. In the hustle and 
bustle Mrs. King took it stand­
ing up. They have many in­
teresting sidelights to tell.

Otherwise the seven-day trip 
w a s  perfect. Unbelievably 
many beautiful flowers, fresh 
pineapple, swimming at W aik­
iki and Maui Beaches, a visit 
at Honolulu with Alfred Wal­
ter who took them  sight-see­
ing to many places of special 
interest including a Chinese 
restaurant, the largest floating 
restaurant in the world.

They toured Pearl Harbor 
and the Punch Bowl, the 
King’s Palace, and attended a 
luau. Their tours included 
many other interesting and 
entertaining sights, all com­
pleted before the quake hit the 
Islands They returned to the 
mainland on an overnight 
flight. All have Hawaiian news­
papers telling a b o u t  the 
quake’s damage, estim ated at 
three and half million dollars.

phasized. Generalized claims 
in the ads do not give full 
information. Instead, rely on 
the directions on the product 
label to tell you w hat the 
produce is designed to do — 
and how to use it properly.”

In cases of damage to the 
environm ent or injury to 
hum an or anim al life caused 
by im proper pesticide handl­
ing, the user is subject to pen­
alties of this .federal law.

Information on the correct 
disposal of pesticide contain­
ers can be obtained by writing 
to John C. White, Commis­
sioner, Texas Departm ent of 
Agriculture, Box 12847, Aus­
tin 78711. Ask for Pam phlet 
num ber TDA-Q-423A.

Know your product! Read 
the label! Follow directions! 
“Those are the ABC’s of safe, 
effective and legal chemical 
use,” said White.

“How you spend your time 
is far more im portant than 
how you spend your money,” 
says Los Angeles m anagement 
consultant David B. Norris. 
“Money m istakes can be cor­
rected but tim e is gone for­
ever.”

FOR EATING OUT PLEASURE

Bring the Whole Family!
Dad, treat Mom and the kids to dinner out 
with plenty of good food in our pleasant 
atmosphere with warm, friendly service.

We Close Every W ednesday

The Center
A Favorite Spot for Family Dining



Muenster
Livestock
Auction

SALE EVERY THURSDAY

We offer our 
service to assist you 
in buying or selling 

of live stock.

B il l  & Sam Hamer
Phone 759-2201

Charles Davidsons 
loin in Reunion

MARYSVILLE — Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Davidson and 
family joined in an Easter re ­
union with dinner and supper 
in the home of her brother 
and sister-in-law, Mr . and 
Mrs. Joe Siegmund at Wal­
nut Bend.

Others there for the day­
long get-together were Messrs, 
and Mmes. Ray Siegmund of 
Fort Stockton, Robert Sieg­
mund and Rocky of Dallas, 
Martin Siegmund and family 
of Aledo, Stanley Bush and 
Reid and David Siegmund 
and Kim of Arlington, Mrs. 
O. B. Siegmund, Mrs. Henry 
Cotton and Mrs. Je r .y  Blood- 
worth of Gainesville.

The children had a ball 
hunting Easter eggs in the big 
hay barn when rain prevented 
an outdoor hunt.

THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE

FOR THE 
GRADUATE

MISS AMERICA
••AJ’’—17 

jewels, 
shock resistant. 

$40.00

When you know what makes a 
watch tick, you’ll give a Bulova.

Koesler Jewelry
M uenster

U. J. Endreses See 
Holy Land, Greece 
Germany on Tour

A tour of the Holy Land, a 
visit in Athens, Greece, and a 
side trip to Nuernburg, Ger­
many, has left Mr. and Mrs. 
Urban Endres with many hap­
py memories.

They were with a group of 
125 other couples, all winners 
in a Schlitz Brewing Company 
1972 sales contest.

Their trip  started with a ten 
and a half hour flight from 
Chicago to Athens where they 
toured the Modern Constitu­
tion Square, the Acropolis with 
its Parthenon and the Temple 
of Nike and a 360 degree view 
of Athens.

At Athens they boarded the 
ship MTS Jupiter which was 
their floating hotel for nine 
days. On their first stop at 
Kusodasi, T u r k e y ,  they 
boarded busses to the ancient 
city of Ephesus for sight-see- 
inng that inncluded the Arca­
dian Way, the theatre where 
St. Paul preached and the Tem­
ple of Artemis, one of the sev­
en wonders of the world.

Next stop was the Island of 
Patmos, seeing the cave where 
St. John wrote the last book of 
the Bible.

Then to the Island of Rhodes, 
called the Island of Roses, and 
on to the Island of Cyprus 
where Richard t h e  Lion- 
hearted was m arried and 
where the Knights of St. John 
were headquartered. T h e n  
Haifa, Isreal, where they again 
boarded busses to Jerusalem.

Sight-seeing here included 
Church of the Holy Sepulcher 
and the Mount of Olives, a 
walk along the Via Dolorosa, 
the ancient way of the cross 
inside the old walled city, and 
the famous Wailing Wall. From 
there to Nazareth and a tour 
of the beautiful new Church 
of the Nativity, built where 
Christ lived as a child.

The boat returned to Athens 
and Mr. and Mrs. Endres left 
the tour to fly to  Germany 
From Frankfort they went to 
Nuernberg where they visited 
M i s s  Elselore Rottenkolber 
briefly before boarding i 
plane for home. Miss Rotten 
kolber visited in the Endres 
home last year.

Industry files one billion 
federal reports each year.

T7P5P OF
TW6 OCX> C

A  low-cost bank auto loan will put you be­

hind the wheel of that new car you'd like*

Stop in and get the figure-facts on our eco- 

• nomical dnd convenient auto financing plan. 

You'll be glad you did!

MuensterSERVICE 
y ^ B A N K '

» State Bank
Serving the financial needs of this a rea  since 1923

Marysville Will 
Celebrate Church 
Centenary May 6

MARYSVILLE — One hund­
red years of continuous serv­
ice for residents of Marysville 
area, that is the proud record 
of Marysville Baptist Church 
whose parishioners will cele­
brate the centenary Sunday, 
May 6, combining the anni­
versary program with annual 
homecoming festivities.

Services will begin at 10:30 
a.m. with the  Rev. J. Calvin 
Dennis, pastor of Clovis Street 
Baptist Church of Dallas, as 
guest preacher. He is a native 
of the Bulcher area.

Singing by guest groups will 
follow and a picnic lunch will 
be spread at noon. Everyone 
is invited to attend and bring 
a well-filled basket.

The afternoon will be de­
voted to reunioning and visit­
ing. Frizes will be given to 
the oldest man and the old­
est woman attending.

Present M arysville church 
is the second for the congre­
gation. First building dedi­

cated in 1873 was replaced by 
a new structure on the same 
site in 1925. Dedication was 
combined with the first home­
coming celebration in 1926.

First pastor was the Rev. 
Aza Davis. Present pastor is 
the Rev. Albert Spires of 
Gainesville.

A history of the church will 
be read by Douglas Robison at 
the morning service.

Presently there are some 30 
members. Many were lost to 
the community when Camp 
Howze took over Marysville 
farms. T h e  history reveals 
that in 1907 there were 208 
members.

Health Class Tours 
State Institutions

Sacred Heart senior health 
class students went to Wich­
ita Falls on April 13 to make 
a tour of the state hospital.

The group was conducted 
through hospital facilities and 
living quarters of patients and 
were shown patient advance­
ment including arts and crafts 
and a clothing store.

Monday this week the senior 
class traveled to Denton for 
a tour of Denton State School 
and a lecture session.

Notaries Public 
Must File Now lor 
Re-appointment

Secretary of State Mark W. 
White, Jr. announced that all 
presently commissioned No­
taries Public desiring re-ap- 
oointm ent for the new term  
which begins June 1, 1973 and 
ends June  1, 1975, must pay 
the required fee and file a new 
oath and bond with the Coun­
ty Clerk between May 1, 1973 
and May 15, 1973, inclusive.

Secretary of State White 
further stated that any person 
not now a Notary Public who 
desires appointm ent f o r  the 
beginning of the new term  on 
June 1, 1973, should apply to 
the County Clerk before May 
14, 1973. The required appli­
cation forms may be obtained 
from the County Clerk.

Mr. W hite emphasized that 
Notaries Public should not 
send requests for appointm ent 
or for commissions directly to 
the Secretary of State inas­
much as the law specifically 
requires that the County Clerk 
appiove Notary Bonds and 
forward copies of the applica­
tion to the Secretary of State.

Careful grooming may make 
you look 20 years younger, but 
it will not fool a flight of 
stairs.

The same men who rarely 
hear the shrill voice of con­
science never miss the faint 
whisper of tem ptation.

Sporting Goods
Fishing, Hunting — Sports Equipment

R-G Automatic Pistol
25 Cal..:.....1----------  $32,50

1973 Shooter’s Bible
. Reg. $4.95 ..... ....... $3.95

G & L SPORTING GOODS
Quality Merchandise at Reasonable Price
Glenn Links, Owner 109 S. Commerce 

Gainesville

Wednesday Is 
Double Stamp Day

You get twice the usual number of 
Buccaneer Stamps on Wednesday with the 

purchase of $5.00 or more in groceries. 
(Cigarettes not included.)

G G

Fisher's

Sack Sausage _ _
A.F. or Tall Korn

Bacon _

FRYERS
USDA Grade C

lb. 41c
USDA Grade A

lb. 45c

Save 40c when you buy a
10-oz. jar of Folger's 

Instant Coffee Crystals
Special Price 

with this coupon

$1.49
without coupon $1.89

Good thru Saturday, May 5, at Fisher's

Kraft's 16 oz. Miniature

Marshmallows _ _ _ . _ 29c
Jetton's 18 oz.

Barbecue Sauce _ _ _ _ 39c
Del Monte No. 303 Golden

Corn, c.s. or w.k. _ _ 5 - $1.00
Del Monte No. 303 seasoned

Green Beans _ _ _ _ 4 - $ 1.00
Reg. 79c, 6.5 oz„ Pond's

Lemon Fresh Talc _ _ _ _ 49c
Reg. 59c Country Market

Stationary _ _ _ _ _ 39c
Reg. $1.25, 8 oz. Tame

Creme Rinse _ _ _ _ _  79c
Reg. $2.49, 13 oz. New Right Guard

Gillette Deodorant . . .  $1.59

HOME FREEZER BEEF
Whole or half carcass, hind or fore, cut 
to your specifications, double wrap with 

paper dividers and quick frozen.

or bring us your beef 
for processing

Phone 759-4211 _

FISHER'
MARKET 4 GROCERY

Now
daily until 

7 p. m.

Morton's chocolate, 
lemon, banana, coconut

Cream Pie 
14 oz. 29c

Home Fed &  Home Killed

B E E F

.. .lb .7 9 c  

_ _ lb. 89c

Rib Steak _ 

Rump Roast 

Chuck Roast

_ _ . lb. $1.09

_____lb. $1.09

_______ lb. 79c

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 - 46 oz. can Del Monte 
Pineapple Juice

Void after Saturday, May 5

Keith's

French Fried 
Potatoes

32 oz. 35c

A.F. 1 lb. loaf

Home Bake 
Bread
3 - 55c

e s s s s s s s s s s s s s s s s s s a s s

P r o d u c e

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 -16 oz. jar Kraft 
Thousand Island Dressing

Void after Saturday, May 5

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

2 - 20 oz. bottles 
Del Monte Catsup

Void after Saturday, May 5

Arizona 1 lb. bag

Carrots
2 bags 25c

Radishes 
bag 10c

Green Onions 
.■ bunch 10c

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1-2 lb. can Nestle 
Choc Flavored Quik
Void after Saturday, May 5

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 - 28 oz. bottle Pine Sol 
Disinfectant Cleaner
Void after Saturday, M ay 5

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

2-125 ft. rolls 
Cut Rite Wax Paper
Void after Saturday, May 5

„Uvi-'Vv - Mt, •
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THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE

It pays to advertise with the Muenster Enterprise

AFTER EASTER SALE
V3 to  Y2 o f f

Clearance of all Spring Merchandise
Pant Suits, Dresses, Long Dresses, 

Caftans and Sports Wear.
Jr. and Misses Sizes

Thurs. - Fri. - Sat. Only 
All Swim Wear _______  10% off

(cash purchases only )

The Band Box
111 N. Commerce Gainesille

M & S
DAIRY & FARM CENTER

Butler Bins 
and Buildings

Y I E L D  
K I N G  
S E E D

Purina Chows
DeLaval Clay Perfection 

Farm Automation Specialist
Dixon & Highway, Gainesville

Phone: Gainesville, 668-7861 - Muenster 759-2598

Miss Schumacher 
And Joseph Bezner 
Plan June 9 Vows

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Schu- 
um acher of Gainesville have 
announced t  h  e engagement 
and approaching m arriage of 
their daughter Barbara and 
Joseph “Skipper” Bezner, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bezner Jr. 
of Lindsay.

Nuptial Mass and double 
ring ceremony will be solem­
nized on June 9 in St. M ary’s 
Church with the groom’s cous­
in Father Francis Zimm erer of 
Edgar, Wis., officiating.

The bride-to-be is a gradu­
ate of Grayson County Col­
lege school of nursing and is a 
registered nurse at Flow Hos­
pital in Denton. She is a 
granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Alois Haverkam p of M uen­
ster.

A graduate of Lindsay High 
School, t h e  fu ture groom 
served four years in the  U. S. 
Air Force and is now employed 
at National Supply Company.

IT HAPPENED 
35 YEARS AGO

April 29, 1938
New York’s Mayor La- 

Guardia is given rousing wel­
come during a short pause in 
this city . . .  is literally  “k id­
napped” on highway for visit

In All 
The World
No one is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you.

GEO. J .

Carroll
SON

The DODGE BOYS at
Tuggle Motor Company

A u n  d c  a i  i t i c i  it n cA i c *rnnAND BEAUTIFUL DEALS TOO.

See us now!

B eautiful'1% Polara.
The big Dodge 
makes a lot of 

sense.
It's an easy step up in price to 
get Dodge Polara's full-sized 

looks, luxury, and equip­
ment. But it's the engineering 

features, such as Electronic Igni­
tion and Torsion-Quiet Ride, that 
make Polara an outstanding buy.

Beautiful 1Z  Dart Swinger
. . .  with a FREE automatic 

■ K ,  transmission.
The Dodge Boys can offer you the auto­
matic transmission FREE OF CHARGE 

(because Dodge doesn't charge 
them for it) when you buy a 1973 Dodge 

Dart Swinger specially equipped with the 
following optional items: power steering, vinyl 

roof. AM radio. Light Package, whitewall tires, 
deluxe wheel covers, left remote-control mirror, deluxe 

bumper guards, three-speed wipers and electric washers, 
day/night inside mirror. Deluxe Insulation Package, and 
special exterior mouldings.

Extra care in engineering makes a difference in Dodge . . .  depend on it.

Dodge
AUTHO R IZED  DEALER S

e
CHBYStf g

Tuggle Motor Company
Muenster. Texas

on Main Street. FMA’s syrup 
dripping contest ends after 70- 
hour drip with Alfred W alter 
winning first prize w ith his 
guess of 69 hours and 45 m in­
utes. The Rev. Alfred Hoenig 
will read first Mass here June 
1. Farm ers see grain crops 
ruined by hail. Hunter and 
Muense are new operators of 
M uenster Refinery. E s t h e r  
Pels and Henry Weske marry. 
Parish groups send delegates 
to Catholic State League m eet­
ing in Rhineland. Mrs. Oscar 
Detten hosts Linn Home Dem­
onstration Club meeting.

30 YEARS AGO
April 30. 1943

Parochial High sets gradua­
tion for May 17. Local REA 
system observes fifth anni­
versary. M uenster citizens 
send 20,000 cigarettes to ser­
vicemen in Africa. Sgt. A. J. 
Higgins of Myra is injured in 
India. Leona Haverkamp goes 
to Fort W orth to be employed. 
Regina Fuhrm ann and Lt. 
Ray Lewis m arry at Lindsay. 
Local group attends field Mass 
at Camp Howze Easter Sun­
day. Armella Yosten, a rive­
ter in a war plant in Forth 
Worth, spent the Easter holi­
days a t home. WAVE Agnes 
Fette is taking specialized 
training at Stillw ater, Okla. 
WAAC Louise Schmitz is 
training at Fort Polk, La.

25 YEARS AGO
April 30. 1948

Local Boy Scouts collect 3000 
pounds of scrap paper in drive. 
Special m eeting on May 4 
with luncheon is hoped to 
boost the form ation of some 
sort of community welfare or­
ganization — a men’s active 
civic group. Henscheid and 
Hesse buy Furbach site for 
new H&H Feed Store. Grain 
brightens after .93 inch rain. 
Meeting Monday will consider 
organization, of VFW A ux­
iliary. Mis Lena H err begins 
work as switchboard operator 
a t M uenster Telephone Co. 
Anselma Pagel and M.Sgt. Hal 
Falck m arry in San Antonio. 
J  ew e 1 Hoffman represents 
M uenster as d u t c h e s s  at 
Gainesville Circus Roundup.

20 YEARS AGO
May 1, 1953

Bumper grain crop is in 
sight here. Rain for April 
totaled 3.63 inches. Soil con­
servation tour planned and 
sponsored by Civic League 
and Garden Club has to be 
postponed on account of rain. 
The sale of J. B. W ilde’s Piper 
Cub Cruiser has brought an 
end to privately owned planes 
in the community. The Rich­
ard Wehmans, newly m arried

Sta*Nu
An Extra Service 
at no Extra Cost

You can see and
feel the difference.
Homogenizes vital 

textile oil back 
into the fabric

We Give
S & H Green Stamps

Miller's Cleaners
429 N. Commerce 

Gainesville

couple, establish home in 
W ichita Falls. Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Growing observe silver 
wedding anniversary. Subiaco 
Alumni re-elects Father Louis 
president. Farew ell parties 
honor W ilfred Hess and John­
ny Morris before they leave 
for arm y service.

15 YEARS AGO
May 2. 1958

M uenster is spared as severe 
w eather of rain, hail and high 
winds lash extensive areas of 
the state including parts of 
Cooke County. Hospital pro­
posal for Cooke County is 
vetoed by strong majority. 
W hitesboro will host annual 
S o i l  Conservation Awards 
Banquet. Father Frank Mor­
gan of Gainesville w ill be 
guest speaker at SHH athletic 
banquet. Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred 
Klem ent are back in M uenster 
after being at Fort Knox, Ky., 
where he received his army 
discharge. The Nick Yostens 
observe their 40th wedding 
anniversary.

10 YEARS AGO
May 3. 1963

Dial telephone service be­
gins in M uenster area tomor­
row at 2 p.m. Drought is 
broken and crops boosted by 
3.49 in. rain. J. A. Sanders, 
65, dies Friday of heart a t­
tack SH Home-School Society 
elects officers and sees style 
show; Clyde Fisher is new 
president. M uenster’s newly 
organized Junior Chamber of 
Commerce will sponsor L ittle 
League baseball season; Joe 
Galloway is JC  president. MHS 
seniors leave next Tuesday for 
class trip  to Colorado. REA 
loan for telephone project is 
upped $123,000. PTA election 
retains all officers for another 
year; Paul F isher continues 
as president. Last item  of 
hospital equipm ent is ordered. 
Father H erm an Laux is named 
pastor of Rhineland to replace 
Father A nthony Schroeder. 
Kuhn relationship attends in­
vesture of monsignor Behrens, 
a realtive, in Iowa. Jeanette  
W alterscheid and Johnny Rei­
ter m arry. The Eddie Grew- 
ings leave M uenster to live 
at Gainesville. New arrivals: 
boys for Messrs, and Mmes. 
Jam es Hess and Roy Swir- 
czynski.

5 YEARS AGO
May 3, 1968

Jack Jones is appointed 
Prec. 4 commissioner to suc­
ceed Earl Robison. V. M. Ram­
sey, 91, dies. Gareld Payne 
presents cast of 139 children 
in Cinderella operetta. Jaycees 
begin organizing f o r  Little 
League. Stan Endres is cited 
as Boy of Month by Optimist 
Club. Final rites are held for 
Charles O. Cash, 78. Some 700 
members and guests gather for 
annual m eeting of C o o k e  
County Electric Co-op. Annual 
awards banquet honors MHS 
scholars and athletes. Father 
of H. H. Homsely dies at age 
82 in W eatherford. F irst pack 
meeting of local Cub Scouts 
is attended by 93 boys, par­
ents and leaders. Sixty-tw o in 
Head S tart class here end 
year with graduation. Mr. and 
Mrs. Dolphy Joe Heilman en­
joy all expense paid flying 
trip  to New York City courtesy 
of Full-O-Pep Feeds. Mr. and 
Mrs. Lenny Zim m erer are at 
home in Dallas following m ar­
riage, she is the form er Miss 
Mary Ann Goodwin. Sister 
Corrine Koesler is chosen for 
study of German at M ontana

Gifts she will enjoy every day.
HANGING BASKETS

Many colors & types with plants &  flowers

TERRARIUMS
Various shapes and sizes

Or give her the Basket or Jar, 
Plants and Potting Soil for Mom 

to plant herself.

Trees and Shrubs - her favorite kind

Come early for best selections. 
Gift Certificates Available.

Muenster Garden Center
OPEN 8 A.M. to 5:30 P.M., MON. THRU SAT 

PHONE 759-2766

University. Lindsay girls win 
regional track meet. New ar­
rivals: boys fpr the Jimmy 
Eberharts and Charles Hales; 
twin girls for the Adam Wolfs 
and a girl for the Leonard 
Haverkamps.

Lose Weight 
Safely

with Dex-A-Diel Tablets 
Only 98c at

W A T T S  B R O T H E R S
Gainesville
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Save Money! 
Save Time!

Prescription Is Our 
Middle Name.

Shop the 
Drive-in Window 

for all your prescriptions 
and drug needs.

W A T T S  
Prescription Shop

302 N. Grand, Gainesville

GRADUATES

SUITS
for

Graduates
Commerce Street Store

Pete Briscoe, Gainesville

For Mother

Naturalizer's Soft Touch
The way you want to look when you're 

feeling easy moving fast. There's a  little heel, 
squared toe and soft white patent all around. 
$24.00.

S & S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S ^ S S S S S S S i

Come Saturday and check our 
Sidewalk Sale.

T & L Shoes
202 N. Dixon, Gainesville 

107 N. Elm, Denton
OK

RIO. US. PAT. OfF.

REINFORCED FILM
u n d I r s la b s .

SIDE WALLS

PENDER COVER

equ I p m e n t T ov ER

PLANT STARTERS

MATERIAL COVER

CRAWL SPACE8

CRIP COVERS

c o n c e a le d  f l a s h in g

Wherever you need an extra-strong fabric to 
protect your work or materials . • . you II 
find VISQUEEN reinforced polyethylene film  
Ideal as an enclosure, cover, lining, sealed 
wrap, ground cloth or air-supported

f lT iils c w e r  a 1001 uses for VISQUEEN film , 
v is it or celt us todayl

C. D. SHAMBUROHR
LUMBER COMPANY

Associate of National Building Centers. Ino.

Phone 759-2232, Muenster
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Mrs. John Steele of Hill- 
crest Manor spent Sunday at 
Gainesville in the home of

THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE

her son and wife, the Bill 
Steeles where John Steele also 
was a guest for dinner.

Hoedebeck GNC
Muenster

'73 GMC Pickups

Dependable Used Pickups 
COMPLETE MECHANICAL SERVICE

May 13
She'll wear it ivith pride ... cherish it 
always. Two bands of lbK gold signify 

husband and ivife. They are joined 
by lustrous synthetic stones marking 

the birth month of each child.
Orders taken through Thursday, May 10, 

for Mother's Day delivery.

Sanders Jewelry
West Side Courthouse, Gainesville

Local News
BRIEFS

Mrs. Joe Kathman en ter­
tained with dinner for her 
niece Sister Mary Beatrice and 
her companion Sister Virgil- 
lus, both of Oklahoma City 
during their visit in M uenster 
last week.

Mrs. Charles Denny of San 
Antonio spent Friday through 
Sunday with her parents the 
Ben Lukes and saw other re ­
latives. Friday the Gene Lukes 
and children drove over from 
Denton to visit his family. Fa­
ther Eugene Luke of Subiaco, 
Ark., and the Harold Lukes 
and family of Arlington were 
visitors during the Easter holi­
days.

Surprise weekend guests of 
Mrs. Dick Cain were her son- 
in-law and daughter Mr. and 
Mrs. Wayne T ra ch ta . a n d  
daughter De Ann of New 
Braunfels. Joining them  Sun­
day were Mrs. Bill McCollum 
and daughters Kelley and 
Tracey of Dallas, Mrs. Cain’s 
m other Mrs. J. S. Hogan and 
Mrs. T. C. Rhone, Mrs. Lonny 
Wetsel and son Robby all of

Dorothy’s 
Fashionette - 

Beauty Salon
Open Tuesday 
thru Saturday

DEANNA ONSTEAD 
VICKIE KUHN 

DOROTHY MITCHELL

665 - 9402
303 S. Chestnut 

Gainesville
"Beauty is not a  Gift, 

It's a  Habit."

Sears C o ld sp o t
C a rn iv a l

Showcasing Big Values for Your Home

62941

SAVE $50.
19.2-Cu. Ft. All-Frostless 
Refrigerator with Ice Maker

462# 13.4-cu. f t. refrigerato r
•  5.8-cu. f t. freezer stores 

201 lbs.
e A utom atic  ice m a k e r  w ith  

320-crescent ice bucket

$ 95
Was $512.95

SHOP AT SEARS AND SAVE
Batiefaction Guaranteed or Your Money Bach Sears 315 E. California S t  

Gainesville, Texas
SEARS, ROEBUCK AND CO.

' $ ■

Bellevue, Stephanie and Me­
lanie Richey of Gainesville 
and Mr. and Mrs. Chris Cain 
of Muenster.

Visiting the J. M. Weinzap- 
fels Thursday w e r e  their 
daughter and husband, the P. 
W. Heilmans of Bristow, Okla., 
who had visited first in Dal­
las, Fort Worth, Lewisville 
and Irving with relatives and 
brought Father Joseph Wein- 
zapfel of Irving w ith them to 
Muenster.

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Klement 
had as six-day guests during 
the Easter holidays her bro­
ther and his wife Mr. and Mrs. 
Bernard Raleigh of Burnsville, 
Minn. Also guests for the holi­
day w ere Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Wimmer and daughter Jenny 
of Hurst.

Mrs. Bailey Orrell of No- 
cona visited Sunday afternoon 
with her sister Mrs. Jack Ho­
gan.

Airman and Mrs. Hank 
Sicking have named their in­
fant son Jason Joseph. He 
w a s  baptized Sunday after­
noon in a 3 o’clock service in 
Sacred H eart Church by 
Father Leonard with Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry  Pels of P ilot-Point 
as godparents. Others pres­
ent were the parents, Mrs. 
Wilfred Sicking and daughter 
Nancy and Brenda Pels. Be­
fore the service a christening 
dinner was held in the Wil­
fred Sicking home with the 
godparents as special guests.

Sunday visitors with the 
George Jetzelsbergers were a 
son and family the Charles 
Jetzelsbergers, Robert a n d  
Julie Ann of Fort Worth. They 
came to M uenster from Col­
linsville where they had first 
visited her m other Mrs. Fred 
Cannon.

Mr. and Mrs. R. P. Cain and 
daughter Paula of Farm ers 
Branch visited her mother 
Mrs. Zena Martin at Hillcrest 
Manor Sunday.

M E N U
M uenster Public School 

May 7 to May 11
Monday — Cornie dogs, pin­

to beans, buttered peas and 
carrots, bread, butter, milk, 
cookies.

Tuesday — Sloppy Jos, buns 
onions, pickles, mustard, milk, 
cake.

Wednesday — C h i c k e n  
noodle casserole, sweet pota­
toes, tossed salad, crackers, 
peanut butter, corn bread, 
butter, syrup, milk.

Thursday — Sausage pat­
ties, buttered peas and carrots, 
tossed salad, bread, butter, 
milk, peaches.

Friday — Barbecued beef, 
creamed potatoes, buttered 
corn, bread, butter, milk, 
cookies.

Gilbert Knabes 
Are Dinner Hosts

Mr. and Mrs. G ilbert Knabe
entertained in their home with 
a pre-Easter dinner for mem­
bers of her family who, at the 
same time, helped her mother 
Mrs. Gene Hoedebeck cele­
brate her April 15 birthday. 
A decorated cake and gifts 
were included.

Guests were Mr. and Mrs. 
Hoedebeck, Peggy, Joe, Toni 
and Fred, the Paul Koedebecks 
and Jeff of Gainesville, the 
Chris Cagles and Wayne Grew- 
ing of Dallas.

Following the Sunday get- 
together Mr. and Mrs. Knabe 
and son Ronny left on a 
week’s trip  to Davenport, Iowa, 
where they were guests of his 
uncle and aunt, the Ward 
Shepherds. On the way back 
to M uenster they stopped at 
Paris, Ark., for a visit with 
Father Paul Hoedebeck.

I t pays to advertise with 
the M uenster Enterprise.

COMPLETE
FUNERAL
SERVICE

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home

It pays to advertise with the Muenster Enterprise

W allace Inglish -s- J. D. McCain
BUSINESS, LIFE & HEALTH INSURANCE 

ESTATE PLANNING HOSPITALIZATION 
GROUP INSURANCE PENSION PLANS

Serving North Central Texas
214-521-0300

817-665-4445 817-387-7916

Shop O ur
S P E C IA L S

Thursday and Friday and 
Saturday Sidewalk Sale

One group ladies'
Dresses & Sportswear_____ Vi price
One group
Children's Dresses _______  V2 price

Chick’s Department Store
Gainesville

Some folks believe the best 
way to start federal aid to 
education would be to teach 
arithm etic in Washington.

~l lo L p c i n t
HERITAGE 

AIR CONDITIONER
MODEL AHLR724BA

24,000 BTU/HR. cooling

230 vo lt operation
Fine fu rn itu re  styling . . .  
simulated walnut roomside face 
complements any room decor

Automatic C ircu la te  fo r large or 
multi-room cooling . . .  powered 
vanes provide a continuous, 
gentle side-to-side sweep of air 
automatically

Four-sided galvanized steel case 
. . .  perfect fo r either window or 
thru-the-wall installation

Three speed operation, automatic 
therm ostat, ventilation contro l

MODEL AHLR724BA

$379
Installed

0 0

OTTS FURNITURE
104 W. Main, Gainesville

WHY Receive Less
on your sav in g s  accoun t?

On Certificate for 
2 to 10 Years

$5,000 Minimum
Dividends Paid 

Quarterly

On Certificate for 
1 or 2 Years

$1,000 Minimum
Dividends Paid 

Quarterly

On Certificate for 
6 Months

$1,000 Minimum
Dividends Paid 

Quarterly
Regular passbook savings now earn 

5% dividend, compounded quarterly
Contact our office soon. First Savings and Loan now has a 

savings plan for all Investors, regardless of the size of the account.

cu w n gs
C fa o c ia tte n ,

BOWIE, TEXAS
504 N. Mason 

817-872-2268



DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC

301 E. Broadway 
665-3521, Gainesville 

If no answ er call 
665-2452

after you see 
your doctor,

bring your 
prescription to

M U E N 5 T E R
P H A R M A C Y

PHONE 759-2833

MPS Teachers Hold 
Term-end Meeting

M uenster Classroom Teach­
ers Organization at their 
April meeting in TP&L build­
ing had Edgar Dyer, president, 
presiding a n d  a representa­
tive from Standard Life In ­
surance presenting h i s com­
pany’s cancer insurance pro­
tection plan.

A fter routine business the 
meeting adjourned for the 
present school term. Meetings 
will resum e a t the beginning 
of the 1973-74 school y e a r .  
Sixteen members attended.

APPLY N O W
We Train Men to W ork As

L I V E S T O C K
B U Y E R S

If you have some livestock 
experience we w ill train you 
to buy cattle, sheep and 
hogs.
For a local Interview, write 
today w ith  your background. 
Include your complete ad­
dress and phone number.

CATTLE BUYERS, INC.
4420 Madison 

Kansas City, Mo. 64111
Tfraininf Cat lit and JBuytrt

Girls Track Team 
Scores 10 Points 
In Kilgore Meet

M uenster High’s entries in 
the girls regional track m eet in 
Kilgore last week scored a few 
points but failed to qualify for 
the state competition.

Doris Felderhoff was fifth 
in the high jum p and the mile 
relay team  ran  fourth. Mem­
bers of that team are Doris 
Felderhoff, L a u r a  Sicking, 
Mary Lou Fleitm an and Bar­
bara Davidson. Combined score 
of the two events was 10 points.

This area’s strongest repre­
sentative at the meet was 
Lindsay, which has developed 
an exceptional team  over sev­
eral years and dominated the 
District 17B meet. The team  
finished third at Kilgore with 
56 points, however only one 
member, Patty  Corcoran qual­
ified for State. She was sec­
ond in the 440.

Another area school repre­
sented was Nocona which 
earned 1 point for sixth in the 
shot put. Another entry was 
ninth in the triple jum p and 
failed to score.

Sunday s c h o o l  teacher: 
“What is the lesson tha t we 
can learn from the story of 
Jonah and the whale?”

Pupil: “People make whales 
sick.”

Here's
where
we keep
great
cars
GREAT!

Endres Motor Company

receives awards

Leadership citation awards for 1972 
for being the leader in both car and 
truck registrations in this area were 
presented to Endres Motor Co. by 
Robt. T. Morris, Ford Motor Zone Man­
ager.

WE START WITH

S uper VaLueJ
AND BACK THEM WITH

Q u a lity  Service
WE HONOR FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE

Master Charge — Bank Americard 
American Express — Diners Club 

Carte Blanche

Our Goal: No Unhappy Owners
Endres Motor Company

Your Ford Dealer Since 1946

(Photo courtesy Gainesville Register)

Donna Schroeder and Jim Lawson Plan 
July 27 Wedding in St. Mary's Church

Announcem ent has b e e n  
made of the engagem ent and 
approaching m arriage of Miss 
Donna Schroeder and Jim  
Lawson who are planning their 
wedding for July  27 at 5 p.m.

Benefit Adds $400 
To Alert System 
For Local Hospital

M uenster Hospital Auxili­
ary ’s benefit dance Saturday 
night added a little  over $400 
to the fund for the organiza­
tion’s project “A lert System ” 
for M uenster Hospital.

A report on the benefit was 
released Tuesday a t which 
time members again thanked 
all who helped make the event 
a success. Added to those prev­
iously mentioned as donors of 
cash or supplies are AMFI 
plant, Fisher’s M arket, M uen­
ster Mill and Geo. J. Carroll 
& Sun. Also for volunteer 
service Boys John Henscheid, 
Karl Koesler, Terry W alter- 
scheid and David Wimmer, and 
Knights of Columbus mem­
bers.

Skating Parties 
Planned for Kids

End of year outings for chil­
dren of three grades a t M uen­
ster Public School were p lan­
ned last Friday in meetings of 
teachers and room m others at 
the school.

The rooms taught by Mrs. 
Selby, Mrs. Weinzapfel, and 
Mrs. W alterscheid all decided 
on skating parties to be held 
at the Gainesville skating rink. 
After that they will go to the 
M uenster City Park  for ham ­
burgers or hot dogs prepared 
b y the roommothers at the 
city park.

Room m others at the m eet­
ings were Polly Fisher, Bertha 
Knabe, Wonda Reiter, Flo 
W alterscheid, H arriet Pagel, 
Pat W alterscheid and M agda­
len Lewis.

in St. M ary’s Church at Gaines­
ville.

Parents of the pair are Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Schroeder, Rt. 3, 
Gainesville, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Leo Lawson, also of Gaines­
ville, form erly of Muenster. 
The future* groom is the grand­
son of Mrs. E. S. Lawson and 
Mrs. C. M. W alterscheid.

Miss Schroeder will gradu­
ate from Gainesville High 
School in June. Mr. Lawson 
is a 1970 graduate of Gaines­
ville High and attended Cooke 
County Junior College. He is 
employed by Tyler & Simp­
son Co. The couple plans to 
reside in Gainesville.

A woman who unexpected­
ly serves her husband a thick, 
sizzling steak for dinner hasn’t 
necessarily wrecked the car, or 
been on a shopping spree, or 
overdrawn the checking ac­
count.

She may have just run out 
of leftovers.

C IT A T IO N  BY P U B L IC A T IO N
THE STATE OF TEXAS

TO : C arl O verton. D efendant,
G reeting :

YOU (AND EACH OF YOU) ARE 
HEREBY COMMANDED to appear 
befo re  th e  16th D istric t C ourt of 
Cooke C ounty a t the  C ourthouse 
thereo f, in G ainesville. T exas, by 
filing  a w ritten  answ er a t o r be- 
10 o’clock A.M. of th e  f irs t M on­
day  n ex t a fte r  the ex p ira tio n  of 
fo rty -tw o  days from  th e  d a te  of 
the  issuance of th is  c ita tion , sam e 
being the 21st day  of M ay A.D. 
1973, to  P la in tiff’s P e tition  filed  In 
said  court, on th e  1st day  of M arch 
A.D. 1973, in th is  cause, num bered  
73-042 on th e  docket of said co u rt 
and sty led  M elinda O verton, P la in ­
tiff. vs. Carl O verton. D efendant.

A b rie f sta tem en t of th e  n a tu re  
of th is su it is as follows, to -w it:

S u it fo r D ivorce.
If  th is  c ita tion  is not served  w ith ­

in n in e ty  days a f te r  th e  date  o f its 
issuance, it shall be re tu rn e d  u n ­
served.

T he officer execu ting  th is w rit 
shall p rom ptly  serve th e  sam e ac­
co rd ing  to  req u irem en ts  of law . 
and th e  m andates hereof, and m ake 
due re tu rn  as th e  law  d irects.

W itness. A nna M ae S horter. 
C lerk  of th e  D istric t C ourt(s) of 
Cooke County. Texas.

Issued and given u n d e r m y  hand  
and th e  seal of said co u rt a t 
G ainesville. Texas, th is  the  6th 
rinv of A pril A.D. 1973.
(SEAL) Anna M ae S h o rte r C lerk, 
D istric t C ourt Cooke C ounty, Texas. 
By P riscilla  B row n, D eputy .
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ikHothc/b you,Love
. . .  with 

Miss Elaine 
Lingerie

Select from a new shipment of gowns, robes, 
house coats and shortie pajamas.

. . .  with pretty dresses and 
4 piece Pant Suits
(skirt, blouse, pants, jacket)

S P E C I A L

Thursday, Friday, Saturday
Pretty assortment of pant suits, 

dresses and  separates.

m a e r-

^Ue Gltabm SUoft
Pearl Evans, Muenster

Mrs. Rosson Visits 
And Has Visitors

Mrs. B. C. Rosson of Myra 
has been on the go crowding 
lots of visiting into the Easter 
weekend and adding more vis­
iting the past weekend. Back 
at home she entertained the 
Myra Sunshine Club and had 
visitors.

Her first visit was with a 
daughter and family, the E. L. 
Bakers at W hitehouse, Friday 
and Saturday, she visited an 
aunt Mrs. Mandy Meeker 
Simday m orning at Browns- 
burro and had dinner with a
daughter, Mrs. E. R. Lenox
and family at Dawson.

Sunday night at a family
gathering she was with her
sisters and brother the Jeff 
Hendersons, Ben Lancasters, 
and C. E. Harrises at t h e  
home of another sister Mrs. 
J. M. Hix and f a m i l y  at 
Blooming Grove.

Monday she visited her sons

FRIGIDAIRE

Frigidaire
Sales & Service

Personality 
Furniture House 

Inc.
2003 E. Highway 82 

668-8833 
Gainesville

Jim m y Prince and family at 
Corsicana and C. E. Prince at
Ennis.

The following weekend she 
visited the E lbert Baker fam ­
ily and they hosted a fish fry 
Friday night in their lake cab­
in at Big Sandy.

Nine Sunshine Club mem­
bers were present in her 
home for their meeting, gift 
exchange, games and refresh­
ments.

Spending Tuesday night 
with her were the Ben Lan­
casters of Corsicana enroute 
home from a trip  to Kansas, 
Arkansas and Oklahoma.

It takes 50,000 pounds of 
engineering draw ing to bu iH  
a jet airliner.

ROSES
Choose from our broad 
Selection of Varieties 

and Colors.
Hybrid Tea
Floribunda
1- gal. $1.45

Climbing 
Hybrid Tea
2- gal $2.45

Patented 
Hybrid Tea

2-gal. $3-$4.0Q

W o o l f o l k
N u r s e r y

E. Hwy. 82, Gainesville

Carpet “ Party-Clean”  
Without Wetting

May is spring cleaning time! 
Your carpeting deserves spe­
cial attention. We recommend 
HOST, the new method of 
cleaning carpets without wet­
ting. Use carpet immediately 
after cleaning. Borrow our 
rem arkable HOST E lectric  
Up-Brush. I t’s easy. Clean 
walk-areas—only $5.95.

CARPET T I L E LINOLEUM

Charles & Dorothy Barnes, Owners 
668-7411, 212 East California

g o a  toMil
for home modernization

Whether your home needs just a few minor repairs 
of extensive remodeling, let us help you plan your project 
and give you free estimates. We can provide the best in a 
wide variety of building materials, skilled workmen to do 
your job, and can also help you obtain financing.

Following is a list of just a few of the many ways 
we can help you make your present home more beautiful, 
more convenient, more livable.

•  Add a  recreation room.
e Brighten up with a coat 

of paint
e Add convenience and 

beauty with new kitchen 
cabinets by IDEAL.

e Enjoy the protection and 
colorful beauty of a  new  
roof by CERTAIN-TEED.
There are many ways to improve and modernize 

your home under F.H.A. Title 1 which provides for easy 
financing -  NOTHING DOWN AND UP TO 60 MONTHS 
TO PAY. Ask us for details.

Community Lumber Co.
Jerome Pagel &  Rody Klement

J ®
4,1
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Lens-View

The controversy over high 
meat prices and the meat boy­
cott did bring out a lot of fav­
orable publicity for the farm ­
er and rancher. Practically 
every national magazine had a 
feature article a b o u t  the 
farm er and explained how he 
would be losing money if it 
were not for the latest price 
increases. This past week 
Texas A&M published an a rt­
icle stating that, considering 
the average price of land in 
Texas today, it was nearly 
impossible to make a profit on 
the raising of grain or on a 
cow-calf operation.

When arriving at the aver­
age cost of land wo presume 
ihey use the selling prices of 
all farm acreage even that 
which sells for thousands of 
dollars per acre near cities — 
which is not sold for farm  land 

-but for industrial use.

i L
For Our 

Vacation?"
A new camper — Sail or 

motorboat — Station wagon? 
Be sure to have it adequate­
ly insured, including liabil­
ity insurance for possible in­
jury to others, which can 
be the greatest financial 
risk of all.

F M  W
(Formerly Weinzapfel)

INSURANCE AGENCY
OLD LINE STOCK 

COMPANIES
MUtNSIf* SIATt SANR BLOG.

PH. 759-2257

If all those people who said 
they were going to w rite to 
the editor would do so we’d 
have many “Letters to the Ed­
itor” for you to read.

* * *
Several people have m en­

tioned that when it rains on 
Easter Sunday it will rain the 
next seven Sundays. Last Sun­
day was a cloudy day and rain 
threatened all day but it did 
not rain. Lets hope there will 
be some sunny dry week ends
for awhile.

* *  *

Heard this week — I t ’s not 
the high cost of living but the 
cost of high living that is hu rt­
ing.

*  *  *

It is interesting to follow the 
activities of the stock m arket 
these days. Most companies 
are reporting record profits yet 
the price of their stocks are de­
pressed. It looks like the right 
time to invest if you are so in­
clined.

Eleven to Receive 
Journalism Awards

Eleven students of Sacred 
Heart High w i l l  receive 
journalism  awards at the all 
awards banquet on May 19.

Myron Hess, Carol Yostfen, 
Debby W alterscheid, Kim Rei­
ter and Christi Koesler will 
get Quill and Scroll pins, 
which signify membership in 
the top third of the class as 
well as exceptional work in 
journalism.

Also Susan Endres, Nanci 
Fuhrmann, Janet Knabe, Gary 
Endres, Ernie M artin and 
Mary Beth Bartush will be 
given National Scholastic Press 
Association pins. To qualify 
for those students must have 
shown ability in journalistic 
writing, photography and re ­
lated work in the field of pub­
lication

The eleven students h a v e  
had articles published in their 
school paper, Mosaics, and also 
in the M uenster Enterprise, 
Gainesville Register and Texas 
Catholic. Their instructor is 
Brother Thomas Moster.

Visiting in Lindsay Sunday 
with Mrs. Joe Bezner Sr. were 
her children the Bob Bezners 
of Richardson and the Bob 
Youngs of Dallas.

Domino Tourney May 4
M uenster VFW Auxiliary 

will sponsor a domino tourney 
Friday night, May 4, begin­
ning at 8 o’clock in the VFW 
Hall. Sponsors are hoping for 
a large attendance at this 
benefit event. Trophies will 
be awarded to winners and re ­
freshments will be available.

FLOWERS 
( o r  your  M o m
a  bouquet, a  nosegay, 
a  corsage, a  pot plant, 
a  hanging basket . . . 
it says "I love you."

Remember Mother May 13 with

3 lo w er4 b y  3 )o lo re3
Across from Muenster Hospital 

759-2577

>

Recliners Rockers
Lamps Pictures
Mixers Hair Setters

Blenders Dryer-Stylers
and many other 

small appliances
Or . . . remember her with a new 
living room or bedroom suite, 
washer, dryer, refrigerator, or 
dishwasher.

HESS FURNITURE 
& WESTERN AUTO

A1 &  Dennis Hess, Muenster

NEWS
OF THE SICK

Miss Clara Ford of Hillcrest 
M a n o r  entered Gainesville 
Hospital Wednesday.

Mrs. Jake Pagel is a m edi­
cal patient at M uenster Hos­
pital, admitted April 26.

Jess Lucas underw ent major 
surgery at M uenster Hospital 
Friday night.

Mrs. Louis Roberg has been 
dismissed from St. Paul’s Hos­
pital after surgery. She will 
re-enter on May 9 for heart 
surgery, May 11.

Mrs. John Schmitz, 903 N. 
Weaver, Gainesville, is a shut- 
in at her home w ith a broken 
knee cap, the injury in a cast. 
The accident happened in her 
yard.

HOSPITAL NOTES
The following patients were 

dismissed during the past 
week at M uenster Hospital.

Tuesday, Apr. 24: Mrs. Mike 
Trubenbaeh, Muenster; Mrs. 
John Dunn, Forestburg; C. E. 
Reeves, Saint Jo; Pete Hansen, 
Nocona.

Wednesday, Apr. 25: Edward 
Gardner. Gainesville; Mrs. W. 
C. Brown, Nocona; Varner 
Pitm an and Jam es Erwin, 
Saint Jo; Mrs. Tom Murray, 
A r gyle.

Friday, Apr. 7: Mrs. Minnie 
Tuggle, M uenster Mrs. Bessie 
Hudspeth, Forestburg; Henry 
Smith, Saint Jo, Archie Hig­
ginbotham, Wichita Falls.

Saturday, Apr. 28: Adam 
Wolf, Muenster; Ardell Gillum, 
Nocona.

Monday, Apr. 30: Paul Dan- 
gelmayr and Mrs. Alice Brown, 
Muenster; Raymond Gaskin, 
Whitesboro, Mrs. John Glenn, 
Gainesville.

Tuesday, May 1: Henry Faut- 
ler, M uenster; Mrs. Zula Mon- 
kers, Gainesville.

Students Attend 
Movie at Denton

Students of grades 8 through 
12 of Sacred Heart School 
were in Denton Tuesday a t­
tending “Sounder” a touch­
ing story of a black Louisiana 
family during the depression 
of the thirties.

Arrangem ents to 3ee the 
movie were made by the Eng­
lish and American history de­
partm ents of Sacred Heart. 
Teachers attending were Sis­
ters Georgia, Mary John and 
Theresina, also Father Leon­
ard, Brother Thomas, J i m  
Gehrig and Mrs. Joe Felder- 
hoff.

THAT'S H m i
SPEED BALL!
The highest estimated

SPEED ATTAINED By A  
PING PONG BALL W AS 
SO MILES PER HOUR
( BV CHUANG TSE-TUNG 

OF CHINA*.

p n m in tm iim i'HH n umi

MAGNIFIED FACT!
WHAT BILL CONTAINS THE 

NAMES OF 26  STATES? THE 
R Y E  DOLLAR B IL L ! (THEY ARE 
ON THE FACADE OF THE 

LINCOLN MEM ORIAL),

LOVE

H  m stissigsgr

gasscSS?-2&2Z!ffl'Sw0*

Judy Dangelmayr 
Honored at Party

Miss J u d y  Dangelmayr, 
bride-elect of Tom Flusche, 
was honored at a kitchen and 
pantry shower Friday night in 
the home of Mrs. Bernard 
Haverkam p with Mrs. RoJean 
Blankenship of Saint Jo and 
Mrs. David W alterscheid as 
co-hostesses.

Members of M uenster Hos­
pital nursing staff attended 
and other guests were mothers 
of the engaged couple Mrs. Al­
bert Dangelmayr and Mrs. J. 
P. Flusche, and Mrs. Tom 
Trachta.

Poultry Industry 
Is More than Just 
"Chicken Feed"

The poultry industry in 
Texas isn’t just “chicken feed” 
or “pin money” any more. A 
check of the value of this in ­
dustry shows gross income 
from production of eggs chic­
kens and broilers during 1972 
totaled more than $3,500,000.

“Several years ago, almost 
every farm had a small flock 
of chickens. But that situa­
tion has changed, a n d  the 
poultry industry in Texas is 
a dynamic, progressive leader 
in the sta te’s agriculture pic-

FROM BLUE SHIELD
Outdoor Cooking Tips 

As the popularity of out­
door cooking increases at 
home and during vacations 
this summer, make sure ade­
quate safety precautions are 
maintained at all times. Never 
leave a lighted grill unattend­
ed and keep children a safe 
distance from the cooking area. 
Make sure you have a fire ex­
tinguisher on hand too. Since 
both burning charcoal and 
lighter fluid can produce a 
dangerous and harmful a- 
mount of carbon monoxide 
when burned in a confined 
area, restrict your outdoor 
cooking from tents, trailers 
campers, automobiles, boats,

garages and other unventi­
lated areas. Finally, make 
sure all coals are doused com­
pletely.

Sunburned Lips
Sunburned lips, as well as a sunburned body, are often the 

result of a fun-filled day in the strong summer sun. Lipstick 
will often provide the necessary protection for women. Other­
wise, outdoor enthusiasts should wear a topical sun-screen ap­
plied directly to the lips. Several different preparations are 
specifically designed for this purpose and are available in a 
colorless stick. Treat sunburned lips with cool, wet compresses 
or a bland ointment If your reaction is severe, consult a 
physician.

The Bargain House
On the Square, Saint Jo

Just arrived new shipment of
LAMPS

SWAY & TABLE
EARLY AMERICAN — SPANISH — MODERN

Draperies 
Bras & Girdles
odd Dining Room chairs

MANY OTHER ITEMS REDUCED 25 to 50%

ture,” Texas Agriculture Com­
missioner John C. White noted.

The gross income figure for 
poultry during 1972 was up 
about $100,000 from 1971.

Of the 1972 gross, 51 per 
cent was from egg production, 
and 46 per cent was f r o m  
broiler production.

Egg production in Texas 
during 1972 showed a slight 
decline from 1971. Broiler pro­
duction in the state, however, 
was up four per cent in 1972 
from the previous year.

Egg prices to producers av­
eraged 30.9 cents per dozen 
during 1972, down slightly 
from 1871 levels. Broiler prices 
for 1972 averaged 14.1 cents 
per pound which was up 
slightly from 1971.

“Consumers who are on the 
lookout for good buys in food 
should take a close look at the 
egg. Eggs are one of the best 
protein buys on today’s m ar­
ket.

“With eggs at 75 cents per 
dozen retail, you are paying 
only about 50 cents a pound. 
Compare that with other 
foods and you can see why 
eggs are such a good buy,” 
White said.

National Service 
Asks for Reports 
On Severe Weather

In late March the Natonal 
W eather Service mailed a 
special Severe Storm Report 
Form to nearly every resident 
on rural mail routes in this 
area. A rem inder was issued 
today asking those individuals 
who received such forms to 
rem ember them when thun­
derstorms occur in their vi­
cinity.

The forms request informa­
tion on such events as hail oc- 
currances, w inds which cause 
damage, tornadoes, etc.j" if 
these events happen to occur 
near the respondent’s home. 
The success of this special pro­
ject will be greatly improved, 
when severe thunderstorm s 
occur over an area, if as many 
residents as possible provide 
the requested information.

Each time a severe event oc­
curs, the information should 
be entered on the form. It is 
designed so that information 
from a num ber of storms can 
be recorded and should be re­
turned when it is full or af­
ter May 31, whichever comes 
first.

Approximately 130,000 forms 
were mailed to rural box- 
holders in 50 selected coun­
ties in Missouri, Kansas, Okla­
homa, and Texas. There is no 
other feasible way to obtain 
t h e  requested information 
than to call for the coopera­
tion of the residents of these 
areas. The results of this sur­
vey will be used with inform a­
tion from special weather 
radars in studying severe 
thunderstorm s. The inform a­
tion thus collected from area 
residents will help in improv­
ing the severe thunderstorm  
detection a n d  w arning serv­
ices of the National W eather 
Service.

With just a little more help 
from the government, there’s 
a forturne to be made in pov­
erty.

How to catch a porcupine: 
Watch for the slapping tail as 
you dash to drop a large tub 
over the animal. This provides 
you with a place to sit while 
you plan your next move.

One of the greatest causes of 
world trouble today is that 
stupid people are so sure about 
things — and the intelligent 
folks are so full of doubts.

Romans 10:13. For who­
soever shall call upon the 
nam e of the Lord shall 
be saved.

The First 
Baptist Church

First <£ Pecan St. 
Muenster

cordially invites you 
to attend its services
10 a.m. Sunday School 

11 a.m. Worship Service 
6 p.m. Evening Service

Rev. Bill Hatler
Pastor

Confetti - - ■
for are already waiting to be 
applied. All we need is official 
action by the right people. 

Who knows but what this
situation will turn out in the 
end to be a blessing in dis­
guise? Necessity may force us 
to ban some of our extrava­
gant ways and develop a few 
new energy sources so we’ll 
be better able to meet the vast­
ly increased demands of com­
ing decades.

NOTICE OF 
PUBLIC HEARING 

A public hearing will be 
held on May 16, 1973 at 8:30 
p.m. in the lobby of Muens­
ter Memorial Hospital, Muens­
ter, Texas on the proposed 
budget of Muenster Hospital 
District for the Fiscal Year 
beginning July 1, 1973 and
ending June 30, 1974.

Board of Directors 
M uenster Hospital District

STATE
in Gainesville

Now thru Tues.
Gene Hackman 

Shelly Winters in
"The Posiedian 

Adventure"

PROGRAM
SCHEDULE

Muenster TV-2
Fri., May 4, 3:30 p.m.

Rev. Russell Clapp 
of St. Paul's Episcopal 

Church, Gainesville 
Father Bede's Guest 

Live Program

Monday, May 7
NO PROGRAM 

Because of May 
Queen Procession 

and Devotions

Tues. May 8, 9-9:30 a.m.
Sacred Heart 

Speech Students

Tues. May 8, 8-9 p.m.
Father Bede's 

Program
Replay of May 4 

Interview with 
Father Clapp

24 hours a day 
calendar of events and 

local weather dials

Now, Choose from 
5 Savings Plans

2 Year certificate 
$5,000 minimum

1 Year certificate 
$1,000 Minimum

5 X S
6 months certificate 

$1000 minimum
on investment savings 

, $100 minimum
on passbook savings 

$5 minimum

The Oldest Savings Association in Texas
EQUAL

HOUSING
LENDER HESPERIAN

BUILDING & SAVINGS ASSN.
SERVING COOKE COUNTY SINCE 1890 

101 E. Broadway, 665-3486, Gainesville
Real Estate Loan Headquarters for Cooke County
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