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Boat Mishap Turns 
Party into Ordeal

HOUSE HUNTING IN KOREA—Carrying his worldly possesions 
with him, a South Korean farmer trudges along a dusty road 
eeking a piece of land to till without the aid of bombs or 
.rtillery. While peace talks continue, thousands of the war'* 

victims roam the land looking for a new home.

Frank Isenman, 86, 
Dies Here Sunday

Frank Isenman, 86 a resident 
of Muenster for the past three 
years, died at 7 p.m. Sunday in 
the home of his nephew. Tony 
Gremminger. He had been in 
failing health for several years.

Rosary was recited at 8 o’clock 
Monday night in the Grem­
minger home and the body was 
taken to Windthorst for burial at 
9 a.m. Tuesday. Very Rev. Al­
bert Schreiber officiated at the 
requiem high mass in S t  Mary’s 
church and at the burial in the 
Windthorst cemetery. Nick Mil­
ler was in charge of funeral ar­
rangements.

Serving as pallbearers were 
Maurice Pagel, Morbert, Tommy 
and Johnny Knabc. Gary Hess 
and Teddy Gremminger.

Mr. Isenman resided in Wind­
thorst for more than 50 years 
before coming to Muenster to 
live in the Gremminger home 
three years ago. He was a native 
of Missouri, .born February 21, 
1866, and came to Texas as a 
young man. He was never mar­
ried.

Falls 35 Feet; Cut 
Bruised, Fractured

H. L. Herron, Katy depot 
agent, sustained multiple cuts 
and bruises and a fracture in his 
right leg, but no critical injuries, 
in a 35-foot fall from a windmill 
tower at his home south of town 
Saturday afternoon.

A f t e r  receiving emergency 
treatment at the local clinic he 
was taken to the MK&T Hospital 
in Denison for further treatment, 
a series of X-rays and a leg cast. 
He will be hospitalized at least 
two weeks

Herron had climbed the wind­
mill ladder to check electrical 
wiring preparatory to making 
repairs and had not cut off the 
current He came in contact with 
a hot line which caused him to 
lose his balance and fall.

A long cut on his right arm 
severed the tendoms and re­
quired several stitches and two 
small fractures, just below the 
knee, made the cast necessary. 
Several smaller cuts also re­
quired surgery.

While Herron is off duty Nor­
ris Largent is in charge at the 
depot. Largent, whose home is 
in Mqpkogee, came here as re­
lief operator from Denison.

Among relatives and friends 
attending the funeral were the 
Tony Gremmingers. Miss Do­
lores Gremminger, the Ted 
Gremmingers, Miss Patsy Gfem- 
minger, the John Knabes, John­
ny and Tommy Knabe, the Nor- 
bert Knabes, Mrs. Leo Sicking. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Hess, the 
Maurice Pagels, Sgt. Teddy 
Gremminger of Fort Worth, Mrs. 
Robert Mayer of Pilot Point, 
Miss Kathryn Hartman. John 
Bayer, Miss Marilyn Gremmin­
ger and Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Martini of Wichita Falls.

Dick Cains Attend 
Niece's Funeral

News of Sick 
And Injured

Jimmy Fuhrman, 8, had his 
tonsils and adenoids removed at 
the local clinic Monday. He is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Val 
Fuhrman.

Kathy McGowan, four year, 
old daughter of the Looney Mc­
Gowans who had her appendix 
removed at M&S hospital, is 
back at home, up and around.

Ben Seyler is convinced it’s 
better to talk with his hands in 
his pockets. He’s wearing a cast 
on his right hand since one of 
his gestures encountered the 
edge of a table. The fracture is 
in the bone above the little 
finger.

Windthorst Beats 
Local Lads 7 to 6

Amber Estes Hurt 
In Oil Rig Accident Picnic Grounds Get 

Electric Lights and 
Concrete Platform

Much has been said, and prob­
ably will continue to be said, 
about the big steal engineered 
by Taft supporters in the Texas 
Republican convention. Eisen­
hower apparently thought the is­
sue was important enough to 
warrant a political trip to this 
state, which in the past has re­
ceived little consideration from 
Republican candidates. Taft also 
has taken notice of the in­
cident and says he is willing to 
abide by the decision of the par­
ty’s convention.

The situation in general is
that there is a big and legitimate 
gripe on each side. Back in pre­
cinct and county conventions 
Ike’s boosters, many of them 
enthusiastic Democrats in the 
past, took over in behalf of their 
champion. Old time Republicans 
who had stuck with the party 
through the lean years suddenly 
found themselves overwhelmed 
by newcomers. It’s easy enough 
to understand their disappoint­
ment and resentment. A man 
who nurses a rosebush doesn’t 
like to have the flower snatched 
away from him.

When state convention time 
came the old party members 
were prepared and gave the 
newcomers a dose of their own 
medicine. Accordingly the state 
delegation to the national con­
vention was pledged to Taft, and 
Ike’s supporters put up a ter­
rific howl

As a person thinks over the
situation he has to admit that 
both factions are right and both 
are wrong, and any one’s indi­
vidual decision will probably be 
determined by whether he likes 
Ike or Bob. Eisenhower un­
doubtedly is favored by the larg­
er number of people. On that 
point it is reasonable to assume 
that he should be the state’s fav­
orite. However the custom has 
been to let the political party 
choose its favorite for the na­
tional convention. On that' point 
it would seem that Taft support­
ers were justified in not permit­
ting the party to be taken over 
by men whose only party inter­
est was their preference for 
Eisenhower.

So. no matter what side a per­
son favors in this squabble, he’ll 
do well to remember that the 
other man’s stand is justified 
about as much as his. It’s better 
for state and national welfare, 
as well as for an individual’s 
own blood pressure, to regard 
the fuss as a mere unfortunate 
circumstance and resolve to vote 
wisely in the November election. 
After all. that’s the election that 
counts.

Above all, we ought to bear in
mind that neither Ike nor Bob 
can be held responsible for the 
fussing done by their supporters. 
It’s still a fact that both are good 
men and deserve the nation’s full 
confidence and respect. Besides, 
either one can win and either 
would be an able president. Our 
principal concern now should be 
that the neck-and-neck race they 
are running for the nomination 
will not end in a deadlock and 
a compromise agreement on 
some lesser candidate. Let’s hope 
delegates will stay with their 
Job until they decide on one or 
the other.

Bui while centering our inter­
est on events to come let’s not 
completely overlook our state 
convention squabbles. Let’s be 
thinking about a nominating sys­
tem that will eliminate the 
chance of another fiasco in 56. 
Texas should by all means have 
a preferential primary like so 
many other states have. Individ­
uals should be given a direct 
vote in selecting a candidate 
rather than rely on the outcome 
of railroaded precinct, county 
and state conventions.

While wishing let's also hope
that the Gossett Lodge system of 
n a t i o n a l  elections will b e 
adopted. That is the method in 
which a state’s electoral votes are 
cast in proportion to the popular 
votes. It gives minorities a 
break and eliminates the mis­
treatment some states have had 
to endure because they are in 
the bag anyway. That same 
principle, incidentally, could be 
applied in this state’s preferen­
tial primary, if and when it is 
adopted. ( . „

A capsized boat on the rough 
water of Lake Texoma turned a 
picnic into a near tragedy, for 
two Muenster couples Sunday 
afternoon.

Misses Florence Fette and Em­
ma Lou Gehrig, home on vaca 
tion from their nursing duties 
at St. Paul’s Hospital, Dallas, 
and Arthur Hess and Johnny 
Rohmer held on to their over­
turned boat for ^n hour and a 
half before they were discovered 
and rescued by Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Seily of Dallas. Traffic on 
the lake was light because of the 
high wind and few boats got 
even within sight of the dis­
tressed party near the middle of 
the lake.

The accident happened about
3 o’clock as Hess was helping 
Miss Fette back into the boat. 
Their grip failed as he was lift­
ing and he fell back against the 
opposite side, to which the othar 
couple had moved. The sudden 
shift of weight turned the boat 
over.

After a few minutes of des­
perate scrambling, including a 
close call for Miss Fette, the 
other three helped Miss Fette to 
the top of the capsized boat and 
took positions around it, and 
settled down to wait for help.

When finally spotted they 
were loaded aboard the Dallas 
couple’s boat and taken to shore. 
The capsized boat was towed in 
behind them. It was 6:30 when 
they reached their car and 
started home.

They had to break into the car 
and cross-wire the ignition to 
get back home. The car keys 
were lost along with other con­
tents of Miss Gehrig's purse 
when the boat turned over. 
Other things lost were the picnic 
lunch and both pairs of the 
men’s shoes.

District 4-H Clubs
Hold 3-Day Camp 
At TP&L, Trinidad

Members 6t the boys and girls
4 H Clubs of District IV re­
turned home Thursday from a 
three-day encampment on the 
grounds of the Texas Power & 
L i g h t  Company’s generating 
station at Trinidad. The 181 
c a m p e r s ,  county agricultural 
agents and home demonstration 
agents were under the super­
vision of W. I. Glass and Miss 
Lida Cooper, district agents, 
Denton.

The program emphasized lea­
dership training, but included 
recreation and fellowship for 
these boys and girls from 19 
counties of north central Texas 
that make up District IV.

The camp carried out an In­
dian motif with the youngsters 
divided into eight tribes, each 
with its “chieftain.”

The leadership training pro­
gram, or “heap big learning," 
was divided into four sections: 
crafts, recreation, safety and 
nature, and citizenship. Two 
tribes teamed together on an 
alternating plan that gave every 
one in camp a part in each ses­
sion.

A. H. Karcher, assistant state 
4-H Club leader from Extension 
Service at College Station, led 
the forum on citizenship. He 
was assisted by Grayson county 
Home Demonstration Agent Zel- 
ma Moore. C. W. Simmons, 
forestry specialist from the E x­
tension Service was in charge of 
safety and nature study.

Crafts were under the direc­
tion of Gerald York, assistant 
Dallas county agent, and recrea­
tion was supervised by Alice 
Guthrie, assistant Grayson coun­
ty home demonstration agent.

In addition, there were 4-H 
ceremonials, group singing, skits, 
flag raising ceremonies, table 
programs, hikes and swimming.

On Thursday morning an eval­
uation of the camp program was 
made by the boys and girls in a 
special session. This was fol­
lowed by a conducted tour 
through the .Texas Power & 
Light Company plant.

A n g e l i n e  Schumacher has 
gone to Borger to spend her va­
cation with her sister, Mrs. W al­
ter Morrison and family. Mrs. 
Morrison is to have an operation 
while hor sister is there.

Survivors include three bro­
thers and a sister in Missouri, 
two nephews, Tony and Ted 
Gremminger, and a niece, Mrs. 
John Knabe of Muenster.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Cain re­
turned Tuesday f r o m  New 
Castle, Wyoming, where they at­
tended funeral services for Linda 
Cain, infant daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Leslie Cain.

The two-day old baby passed 
away at 1:30 a.m. on June 19. 
Funeral services were held Fri­
day afternoon at 2 o’clock with 
the Rev. K. Rice, pastor of the 
New Castle Methodist church 
officiating.

In addition to the parents, sur­
vivors are two sisters, Barbara 
Lee, 8, Jane Gail, 5, and a 
brother Leslie Eli, 18 months; 
also grandparents, the Eli Car- 
netts of Gainesville and the J .  S. 
Bagwells of Myra.

Mr. and Mrs. T. M. Hammer 
and their daughter, Mrs. Charles 
Rosenberg, were in Boswell, 
Okla., Friday to attend funeral 
services for Mrs. Hammer’s 
uncle, Henry Adair, who died at 
his home there Wednesday.

Just a few boners in the last 
half of the last inning cost the 
Muenster Auctioneers a ball 
game Sunday afternoon. Wind­
thorst, playing a good game all 
the way through, converted the 
luclfy breaks into a five run 
rally to nose out the local boys 
7-6

The Auctioneers seemed to 
have the game sewed up after 
the second inning when they 
scored four runs mostly on the 
wildness of the visiting pitcher. 
Tight playing after that allowed 
two more runs for each side be­
fore the visitors’ final big inning.

Pitching was good on both 
sides. Walterscheid allowed 3 
hits and the visiting pitcher 5. 
Fielding was also good. . .except 
that last inning.

Next games on the Auction­
eers’ schedule are Lindsay here 
Friday night and Gainesville 
here next Tuesday night,

Amber Estes is in a Gainesville 
hospital receiving treatment for 
two fractured vertebrae and a 
fractured hip sustained about 
8:30 a m. Wednesday in a drill­
ing rig accident.

He and George Mollenkopf Jr  
working on the F & M rig, were 
on top of a mast pole, about 30 
feet up, when it fell to the 
ground. Both rode the falling ob­
ject most of the way down and 
jumped clear as it neared the 
ground. Mollenkopf escaped in­
jury but Estes took a hard fall.

WITH THE MEN 
IN SERVICE

Teddy Gremminger has re­
ceived a promotion to airman 
first class. He is stationed at 
Carswell AFB in Fort Worth, 
a n d  spent Wednesday a n d  
Thursday of last week here with 
his parents, the Ted Gremmin­
gers.

It’s Sergeant Paul Luke now. 
He received the new rating in 
Korea where he has served on 
the front lines with a signal 
corps for the past ten months. 
His parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry Luke.

Melvin Herr, stationed a t 
Kingsville, the home of naval air 
jet training, spent a three day 
pass here with his parents, the 
Frank Herrs, returning to his 
base Monday.

Marine Pvt. James Bayer is 
on an overseas leave visiting his 
parents, the Frank Bayers and 
family. He has completed train­
ing at San Diego where he has 
been stationed since entering the 
service last Feb. 28. This is his 
first visit home since that time.

Sgt. Ernest Sicking returned 
to duty Monday at Carswell 
AFB, Fort Worth, after being 
home on leave to help his father, 
Ben Sicking with the harvest,

John R. Furbach, seaman ap­
prentice, is on a cruise to Kings­
ton, Jamaica, as a part of his 
Naval Reserve training. He is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Furbach of Amarillo, former 
Muenster residents.

Sgt. Robert Bayer arrived Fri­
day to spend a 30-day leave with 
his mother, Mrs. Joe Bayer and 
other relatives. He spent the 
past year in Korea, most of the 
time on the fighting front with 
the 25th Infantry Division. He 
will go from here to Fort Sill. 
Okla., for his new assignment.

Joe Moster, A A, of Corpus 
Christi was here Sunday to 
spend the day with his mother, 
Mrs. Theresa Moster and family. 
He is regaining his strength 
following major surgery and ex­
pects to resume his usual duties 
at the base in about another 
week.

Cpl. Donald Walterscheid has 
written his parents, the C. M. 
Walterscheids, that he has ar­
rived safely in Germany and is 
located “somewhere along the 
Rhine”. He added that he would 
give more detailed information 
when he is permanently settled. 
His address is: CpL Donald 
Walterscheid, US 54056505; 98th 
Ord. Field Maint. Co.; A.P.O. 
403, c-o P.M.; New York, N. Y.

The Alois Haverkamps are 
hearing regularly from their son, 
Pvt. Walter Haverkamp who is 
now on duty with a heavy mor­
tar company at H e a r t b r e a k  
Ridge in Korea. Walter says he’d 
like to hear from his friends. His 
address is: Pvt. Walter Haver­
kamp, US 54073398; Heavy Mor­
tar Co., 35th Inf. R egt; A.P.O. 
25, c-o Postmaster; San Francis­
co, California.

Judge Earl P. Hall, chief 
justice of the Court of Civil 
Appeals serving this area of 
Texas, this week authorized the 
Enterprise to announce his can­
didacy for re-election.

His formal statement to voters 
will appear in a later issue of 
the Enterprise.

Two major improvements to 
the parish picnic ground feature 
preparations for the annual com­
munity picnic to be held on the 
4th of July. Texas Power and 
Light Company is installing 
electric service and a group of 
parish volunteers led by J .  P. 
Flusche is building a 45 x 75 con­
crete slab for dancing and skat­
ing. •

Early Wednesday the right of 
way was ready for installation 
of the electric lines and ground 
was cleared for the platform. 
Flusche said both jobs will be 
finished this week if work goes 
according to plan.

Accordingly picnic plans have 
been changed. It will extend into 
the night, and the annual July 
4th dance will be on the plat­
form rather than inside a build­
ing in town.

Another new development in 
picnic plans is a program of 
three short skits and dancing acts 
to be presented by a group of 
local kiddies under direction of 
Jerry Moore. A truck floor will 
serve as their stage.

Festivities at the picnic will 
begin shortly before noolf. Boxed 
chicken dinners will be available 
and visitors are urged to come 
and have their noon meal there. 
Iced drinks, sandwiches and the 
usual array of picnic concessions 
are also on the program.

The picnic is a benefit for the 
new church fund, and workers 
are drawn from the first fourth 
of names in the alphabetical list 
of the parish, with Arthur Endres 
as general chairman. Other par­
ish groups will have charge of 
the picnics on Labor Day, 
Thanksgiving and Easter.

Miss Doris Heilman has re­
turned to Dallas, where she is a 
student nurse at St. Paul’s Hos­
pital, after a two-weeks vaca­
tion during which she joined 
Mrs. Rudy Heilman and children 
Gretchen and Dolphy Joe, on a 
trip to Milwaukee, Wis., to at­
tend Monte Heilman’s gradua­
tion at Marquette University. 
GTetchen remained for an ex­
tended visit with her brother.

SCHEDULE OF 
COMING EVENTS

FRIDAY, June 27, Auctioneers 
vs Lindsay here.

SUNDAY, June 29, Joint social 
and covered dish supper for 
members of St. Joseph’s and St. 
Anne’s Societies, in the lunch 
room, 8 p.m.

TUESDAY, July 1, Lions 
Luncheon, noon, at school.

TUESDAY, July 1, Auction­
eers vs Gainesville here.

WEDNESDAY, July 2, Get- 
Together Club meeting, in the 
home of Mrs. Werner Endres, 
2 p.m.

FRIDAY July 4, Community 
picnic at parish picnic grounds.

Gift Party Honors 
Ferdinand Wenks

The “get-acquainted” party 
and shower honoring Mr. and 
Mrs. Ferdinand Wenk and child­
ren, new-comers to Muenster 
from Germany, was an enjoy­
able affair Sunday evening. The 
event was sponsored by the 
parish St. Anne’s Society and 
was held on the lawn at the 
Weinzapfel home. It was a sur­
prise for the Wenks.

About 65 persons were present 
and 15 families, who were un­
able to attend sent gifts.

Mrs. H. J .  Fuhrman extended 
welcome in German and after 
the honorees opened and dis­
played their gifts, the group en­
joyed singing German songs and 
visiting. Refreshments w e r e  
served at the close by the spon­
sor group. A special delicacy for 
the lunch was old fashioned 
“black bread” prepared by Mrs. 
Weinzapfel from a German 
recipe Mrs. Wenk uses. It was 
served with butter and honey, 
cookies and cold drinks.

Guests registered in a guest 
book at which Rosa Driever pre­
sided. Among those registering 
were Fathers Louis and Cletus.

Judge Earl P. Hall 
Seeks Re-election



Something New 
At the Variety

TANK LIFTER —Designed for moving artillery pieces, tanks, bridge sections and trucks is the jet- 
powered XH-17, the world’s largest helicopter. The tank-carrier is powered by two turbojets which 
send power through ducts up the rotor shaft and out to the tips of the giant rotor blades. The 
king of the ’copters straddles a cargo, picking up loads by attachments to the landing gear and body.

EVERYONE
IS
TALKING 
ABOUT 

BUTTERICK • 
PRINTED 
PATTERNS!
Come in today to see them 
and our wonderful selection 
of exciting new fabrics.
We have all the newest 
woob, silks, rayons, and 
cottons in a dazzling array 
of colors. Style them in 
Butterick.

The
Variety Store

J

Muenster

Local News
BRIEFS

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Swirczynski 
and son, joined by her sister, 
Marie Holloway and her friend, 
Hazel Prine, spent Tuesday here 
with Ed’s parents.

Gene Hoedebcck attended a 
Chevrolet s e r v i c e  managers 
meeting in Dallas Tuesday. His 
wife and children, Linda and 
Paul, accompanied him and 
spent their time with relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Hart and 
' children have returned to Dallas 

after taking a vacation trip to see 
her brother, Capt. Pat Stelzer 
and family at Great Falls, Mont. 
They also went to Canada. Pike’s 
Peak, Yellowstone National Park 
and Glacier Park. Mrs. Hart is 
the former Verena Stelzer.

The John Tempels had as 
guests Friday night and Satur­
day his cousins, Rupert and 
Leonard Tempel of Paulding.

Announcing the opening of

Acrobatic School
Friday, June 27,2 - 4 p.m.
Children. 3 to 12 years, per lesson 50c 

Children. 12 or over, per lesson 75c 
Private lessons 1.50

Good Healthy Exercises

JERRY MOORE
In Wolf Hotel Ph. 100-R or 37

Ohio. It had been 10 years since 
Rupert visited here and four 
years since Leonard had been in 
Muenster.

The Albert Schillings have 
advised relatives here that they 
moved during the weekend from 
Roscoe to Big Lake, Texas, 
where his oil well drilling job 
has transferred him.

The Claude Cannons and Ron­
nie, the Alec Cannons and the 

fErnest Hymans and Reva Jo  
gathered at the Jesse Goff home 
at Bulcher Saturday for a 42 
party.

Miss Rosalee Fuhrman has re­
turned from a two week va­
cation in Saint Louis, Mo., with 
her brother, Bill Fuhrman, and 
other relatives including the 
Alvin Erpeldings and the Ben 
Theisens.

Duane Cannon left Saturday 
to work at Perryton, Texas, 
during the harvest.

The J .  M. Weinzapfels had a 
letter from their daughter, Ju a­
nita. advising that she will be 
home soon from Germany. Ar­
rangements were complete for 
her return and she was then 
a w a i t i n g  air transportation. 
Juanita taught school in Weis- 

I baden during the past term.■ i —
The N o r m a n  Lukes and 

daughter. K a r e n ,  returned to 
Fort Worth Tuesday evening 
after a several days visit with his 
parents, the Joe Lukes.

Miss Dolores Boyles is spend­
ing this week in Denton with 
her cousin. Miss Belva Jones.

Miss Rosalee Beyer of Lindsay 
spent several days of the past 
week in Muenster with her sis­
ter, Mrs. Ferd Luttnver and 
family. Rosalee was on a two- 
weeks vacation from duties at 
Dr. Mill's office.
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INCKEA SE IN 
INCOME!

Your future is worth 
SAVING for - - -

Plot a  graph of your future now 
and guarantee a  rising line for 
the years ahead by planning a  
budget of regular savings.

MUENSTER STATE BANK
A GOOD BANK TO BE WITH ^
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The C. W. Ratliffs of Lubbock 
combined a visit in Muenster 
with a business trip to Dallas 
during the week end. Mrs. Rat­
liff and the boys remained here 
while C. W. attended a Texas 
Tech directors meeting Satur­
day afternoon and represented 
the Lubbock Avalanche Journal 
at the Eisenhower dinner and 
press meeting Saturday night 
and Sunday morning. The family 
returned to Lubbock Sunday 
night.

A man who has reformed him­
self has contributed his full 
share towards the reformation 
of his neighbor.

THEY SAID IT
The best executive is one who 

has sense enough to pick good 
men to do the work he wants 
done, and self-restraint enough 
to keep from meddling with 
them while they do it.

Theodore Roosevelt
When I was a boy I was told 

anybody could become president; 
I’m beginning to believe it.

Clarence Darrow
It is curious and sad the way 

much of the intellectual climate 
of this country has changed. 
Once we roared like lions for 
liberty; now, we bleat like sheep 
for security.—Dr. Norman Vin­
cent Peale.

Government should restrain 
men from injuring one another, 
but leave them otherwise free to 
follow their own pursuits of in­
dustry and employment.

Thomas Jefferson.
The great use of life is to 

spend it for something that will 
outlast it.—William James

Mechanic: “My advice is to keep 
that car of yours moving." 
Owner: "Why?”
Mechanic: "Well, if you ever 
stop, the cops will think it's an 
accident.”

"Are you positive the defend­
ant was drunk,” asked the judge, 
“and why are you so certain?” 

"Well,” replied the officer, 
"the thing that decided me was 
when I saw him put a penny in 
a patrol box. look up at the clock 
on the city hall and shout, ‘Gad- 
I’ve lost 14 pounds’."

Officer: "Are you happy now 
that you’re in the Army?”

G. L "Yes sir.”
Officer: “What were you be­

fore you got into the Army?”
G. I. : Much happier."

Home Service Adviser (find- 
in  g young bride in tears): 
“What’s wrong dear?"

Bride: “I made a cake and put 
it in the freezer an hour ago and 
there isn’t and frosting on it y e t”

Keep your face always toward 
the sunshine—and the shadows 
will fall behind you.—Walt Whit­
man.

The Southern father was in­
troducing his family of boys to 
a visiting governor. “Seventeen 
boys,” he exclaimed, “ and all 
Democrats but John, the little 
rascal. He got to readin’."

When a youth, Glenn Cum- 
mingham, the runner, was so 
badly burned, it was feared he 
would never walk.

Taking 
Pictures?

See us about films . . . any size. 
And bring your exposed films to 
us for developing and printing.

Be prepared for your outings 
with SUNTAN LOTION

ie Drug Store
M UEN STER, T E X A S

TT y .J SM

SECRETA RIES’ BEST FRIEND —Secretaries visiting the annual 
Inventors' Fair in Paris have shown-so much interest in this gadget 
that it is to be put into production. A tin can. an auto hub cap, a 
note Tad and an alarm clock were used to fashion the original 
model. A nimble secretary can light her desk, take notes, and time 

appointments with the minimum of effort, by using the device.

Sponsored by St. Mary's Parish

Friday, July 4
On Adolph Dudenhoeffer Farm
.(Turn east 3 miles south of Gainesville on Highway 77. 

Road will be marked.)

Eats Drinks Games
LOTS OF FUN FOR ALL

All Eyes are on Chapman s

SALE of sales
.  nationally 

advertised 
S H O E S

. . for DRESS 

. . for SPORT 

. . for PLAY

Just a  few more days of these terrific- savings! 
Buy one pair at the regular price and you get an 

extra pair of equal value or less for only one centl
Get both pairs for yourself or bring a friend and
split your purchase with her.

Jacquelines__ _ 8.95 to 9.95
Natural Poise 8.95 to 9.95
C on n ies........ 5.95 to 7.95
Paris Fashions........ 3.95 to 5.95

G U a jb m a n 'l SU aeA
Phone 499 Gainesville 111 N. Dixon

a pair

when you 

buy one pair 

crt the

regular price.



Political
Announcements

The following persons have 
authorized the Enterprise to an­
nounce their candidacies for 
public offices, subject to the 
July Democratic primary elec­
tion.

State Senator
JO E D. CARTER (re-election) 

Chief Justice 
Court of Civil Appeals 

Earl P. Hall ( re-election) 
District Judge 

BEN W. BOYD (re-election) 
County Judge

JOHN ATCHISON (re-election) 
SHELBY FLETCHER 

Commissioner, Precinct 3
J .  E. (Earl) TAYLOR 

(re-election)
Commissioner, Precinct 4

JOHN B. KLEMENT 
(re-election)

County Sheriff 
EMORY HORN (re-election) 

ALBERT M. B1FFLE 
O E. WHISNAND 
Representative of 

Cooke-Grayson Counties 
RICHARD S. STARK 

Tax Assessor-Collector 
RAFE I. (Irish) PIPER 

District Clerk 
WOODROW U. CLEGG 

(re-election)
County Attorney 

CARROLL SULLIVANT 
(re-election)

County Treasurer 
MARY WOODS 

MRS. W ILLIE MAE GRUNDY 
(re-election)

County Clerk
TOM BLOUNT (re-election)

Local News
BRIEFS

Mr. and Mrs. J .  Y. Hobbs and 
two children of Holliday were 
brief visitors here Friday en- 
route to Gainesville to visit her 
parents, the J . M. Smiths, and 
Saturday joined them in atten­
dance at the funeral of Mrs. 
Smith’s brother,J. M. Abel in 
Marietta, Okla. The Hobbs fam­
ily formerly lived here.

Sisters Car.isia, Geraldine and 
Anna left Tuesday for Jonesboro, 
Ark., to attend an annual retreat 
at the motherhouse, Holy Angels 
Convent.

Miss Olivia Stock spent Fri­
day in Dallas attending a dinner-

Cleaning
Pressing

We pick up on call

Shoe
Repairing

Cavalier Polish

TAILOR MADE 
SUITS AND SLACKS

Nick & Adelina
MUENSTER

PLUMBING AT ITS B B T

Chas. L. Wilson
801 E. Calif. Phone 358 Gainesville

fine
Wedding 

■> Photography

PORTRAITS and CANDIDS

t
You can look
fresh and feel 
fresh for your 
picture. Our 

entire studio is 
cooled with 

refrigerated air.

Gilbert Studio
Miss Io Gilbert Mrs. Mary Block

106 W. Elm, Gainesville

meeting for Chevrolet book- j 
keepers and visiting friends.

Florence Ann Jenkins, daugh­
ter of Mrs. W. G. Stewart of Dal­
las, visited during the week with 
her cousins, Donny and Jerry 
Trubenbach. Florence a c c o m ­
panied the Martin Trubenbach 
family home last Thursday after 
they spent the day in Dallas.

Mr. and M rs~W . W. Collins 
and son, Dave, of Harlingen 
were guests of the A1 Horns 
Tuesday and Wednesday.

The C. F. Gobbles and son,
Larry, are vacationing with his 
mother, Mrs. Mary Gobble in 
Kansas, and her son, Pat Kathey 
and family in Missouri While 
they are away Mrs. Henry Pick 
is in charge at the Muenster 
Hatchery.

The L. A. Bemauers and John 
David Meurer returned last 
Wednesday from a visit in Pan­
handle with his brother, Joe 
Bernauer and family.

Mr. and Mrs. J .  W. Fisher and 
daughters, Joanne and Therese, 
were in Austin for the. funeral of 
Ferd Kinane Friday. A former 
state deputy of the Knights of 
Columbus, Kinane was a fre­
quent visitor in Muenster in con­
nection with activities of the 
order. Among other friends at­
tending the last rites were Joe 
Walter and F. E. Schmitz of 
Gainesville.

Mrs. M. J .  Endres had as her 
guest Saturday to Monday, her 
brother Bert Fisch of Fort Worth

Mrs. Jesse Mitchell and daugh­
ter, Melinda Jean, are spending 
this week in Corpus Christi with 
Mrs. Mitchell's parents, the M. C. 
Milligans. They made the trip 
with her sister and husband, the 
C. O. Coes of Corpus who spent 
the weekend in the Mitchell 
home.

Mr. and Mrs. Andy Monday 
and children spent Sunday in 
Dallas with her sister and hus­
band, the Bill Frys.

The Tony Grcmmingers and 
the Maurice Pagels drove to 
Archer City Sunday to visit at 
the bedside of Mrs. Gremmin- 
ger’s father, H. J .  Weinzapfel.

Guests in the Jess Richey 
home this week are their daugh­
ter and husband, the Charles 
Brewers and three sons of Abi­
lene.

BULCHER HD CLUB HAS 
COOKING DEMONSTRATION

The Bulcher Home Demonstra­
tion Club members enjoyed their 
regular meeting Thursday, June 
19, in the home of Mrs. R. H. 
Sharp. Mrs. J .  M. Shields had 
charge of the program during 
which Mrs. R. J .  Samples and 
Mrs. Claude Cannon gave a 
demonstration on making Hush 
Puppies.

Members answered roll call by 
telling “The things I practice to 
keep good health”. Mrs. Johnie 
W est gave a report on the last 
council meeting she attended, 
and members discussed plans for 
a booth at the county fair. They 
set Ju ly 31 as the date for the 
annual club picnic. It will be 
held in the Bulcher Park. *

After business, the Hush Pup­
pies, a green tossed salad, ice 
box cookies and punch were 
served to Mmes. Dexter Dennis, 
Dexter Dowd, A. Hyman, Calip

Cannon, Johnie West, Effie West, 
Claude Cannon, R. J .  Samples, J . 
M. Shields, and R. H. Sharp.

Mrs. John Knabe and her 
daughter, Mrs. Leo Sicking, re­
mained to spend several days in 
Windthorst with their daughter 
and sister, Mrs. Joe Schroeder 
and family after attending the 
funeral of Frank Isenman Tues­
day.

Guests of Mayor and Mss. 
John Hoffman Saturday were his 
nephew and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Morath and two sons of 
Wichita Falls.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruno Fleitman 
and children, Sarah and John 
David, returned Saturday from a 
vacation trip to Carlsbad, N. M. 
and other places of interest.

Maxie Swirczynski who at­
tends Mt. Carmel Seminary in 
Dallas is at home for the sum­
mer vacation.

A CAPITOL JO B — From his 
perch atop the headdress of the 
Statue of Freedom, which tops 
the dome of the U. S. Capitol 
Building in W a s h i n g t o n ,  a 
workman waves to the camera­
man who snapped this picture 
with a telescopic lens. The acro­
batic workman was replacing a 
platinum-tipped lightning rod 
on the 287-foot-high building. .3argain!

PARK IS BEAUTIFIED 
BY BULCHER COMMUNITY

With "picnic season” just 
ahead for the Bulcher commu­
nity, the residents have Jjeen 
busy beautifying the Bulcher 
Park. The site has been weeded 
and mowed, trees have been 
white-washed, and tables and 
benches have been favored with 
fresh paint.

Among gatherings scheduled 
to take place in the park are: 
Friday night, family night for 
the Saint Jo  Baptist church; the 
July 4 picnic sponsored by the 
Masonic lodges of Marysville, 
Saint Jo  and Illinois Bend; the 
Bulcher Home Demonstration 
Club’s annual picnic on July 31; 
and the regular meetings of the 
Progressive Club and family 
gatherings that will take place 
during the summer.

The c i t i z e n s  of Bulcher, 
through the Progressive Club, 
are making special efforts to 
keep the park clean and inviting 
in appearance throughout the 
picnic season, members of the 
club said.

12ft. Kelvinator home freezer 
\ only slightly used.

New Philco 
Appliances

RANGES . . . REFRIGERATORS 
AIR CONDITIONERS . . . FREEZERS 

RADIOS '

Fisher's Market & Grocery
Muenster, T c xa s

Mrs. Bill Stelzer returned Sun­
day from a week's visit in 
Fort Worth with her niece Mrs. 
Henry Luebbert and family and 
her brother, Dan Bradley and 
other relatives. She also joined 
the Fort Worth relatives on a 
trip to Dallas to visit friends.

The John Hoffmans a n d  
Gladys Ann and Mrs. Earle Otto 
and daughter, Elaine, were in 
Wichita Falls Sunday for a visit 
with their son and brother, T. J . 
Hoffman and wife. They were 
all dinner guests of Mrs. T. J .  
Hoffman’s mother, Mrs. C. O. 
Simmons at noon.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Fetsch were 
Fflrt Worth visitors Tuesday.

MARYSVILLE HD CLUB 
HEARS TALK ON POLIO

Mrs. Bill Moon discussed pre­
vention and treatments for polio 
at the regular meeting of the 
Marysville Home Demonstration 
Club in the Community Center 
building.

Mrs. Earl Robison was hostess 
and also had charge of the busi­
ness session. Mrs. John Richey 
directed the recreational period.

After adjournment refresh 
ments were served to 10 mem­
bers and one visitor, Mrs. Earl 
Cravens.

The next meeting will be held 
on June 27 in the home of Mrs. 
John Richey.

for SUMMER SLUMBER

Here's the way to look pretty 
and sleep comfortably when 
the temperature soarsl It's our 
newest gossamer batiste, 
sleeveless and with a wonder­
ful deep V-neckline . . .  all 
frosted with imported French 
Val lace and daintily ruffled. 
"Tailored by Katz" for easy 
washability . . . long wear. In 
Pastel Pink, Blue, Maize, Mint 
Green.
Sties 33, 34, 36, 33, 40. * 2,88

IT'S A

Breezy idea for cool sleeping 
on hot nights . . . this bra top 
Summajama* "Tailored by 
Katz" In striped Crinkle 
Crepe. Both bra and pantie 
elasticized at back to give 
you perfect fit and comfort.
Red and white, green and 

white in sixes 32 to 40.
$1.98 to $2.98

Clayton's
Gainesville

It Happens Twice A Year!

SEMI-ANNUAL
C L E A R A N C E

Life Stride Shoes
j ?

$> •

.0’

^ 5

> K. A wonderful opportunity to
buy a  variety of styles, Dressy, 
Casual, Tailored, at Real 
Savings I&

Hurry in for your best se­
lection during this, —  Twice 
yearly event. All sales Final.

Iren e's Ladies Shop
Gainesville
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H I R E D  H A N D S  
By George Peck

It’s a simple story—I’ve told 
it before and you’ve probably 
heard it many times—but it 
packs such a terrific moral that 
it cannot be told too often.

It’s the tale of the harassed 
farmer who, in desperation, 
hired a hand whose qualifi­
cations for the job seemed rather 
dubious. To the farmers ques­
tion as to what the prospective 
employee knew about farming, 
the applicant replied, “Well, I 
know how to sleep on windy 
nights.”

The farmer failed to see just 
how ability to sleep on windy 
nights could qualify a man to 
be a good farm hand. However, 
he was so badly in need of help 
that he hired the man.

To the farmer’s agreeable sur­
prise. the new hand more than 
measured up. He was a hard, 
tireless and efficient worker. 
Not only did he do all that the 
farmer told him to do, but he 
undertook a lot of extra jobs on 
his own.

Then, one night came a big 
wind. It awakened the farmer. 
Remembering the damage done 
by previous winds, he sprang out 
of bed ready to go into action. 
He called to the new hired hand 
to get up. Getting no response, 
he went to his room, shouted at 
him, shook him. but all he could 
elicit was a grunt. That hired 
hand hadn’t been kidding when 
he said, “ Well, I know how to 
sleep on windy nights.” 

Disgusted, the farmer went 
out alone to the barn expecting 
to find doors burst open and 
things blown hither and yon. To 
his delighted surprise, all was 
shipshape. Some of the odd jobs 
the hired hand had done on his 
own had consisted of fastening 
securely anything and every­
thing that the wind might dam­
age. At long last it dawned on 
the farmer that being able to 
sleep on windy nights was proof 
positive of farming ability, not 
to mention evidence of fore­
sight and wisdom. He switched 
from inwardly cussing out his 
hired hand to mentally praising 
him.

Now. there is a lesson to be 
learned from this simple story 
that applies to the present sad 
state of our national affairs. 
Over the past 20 years our 
economy has gotten into a sad 
state of disrepair because we 
have not been too careful in se­
lecting our hired hands—we 
have put too many on the job 
who haven’t the faintest idea of 
HOW TO SLEEP ON WINDY 
NIGHTS.

Next November 4th, we, the 
people, are going to hire a large 
number of new hands, including 
a superintendent (known as 
President), approximately 3 2 
foremen (U. S. Senators) and 
435 workers (Representatives). 
In hiring these hands we must

make sure that they have the 
“know-how” and the will to re­
pair our badly damaged econ­
omy. We must have their as­
surance that THEY KNOW 
HOW TO SLEEP ON WINDY 
NIGHTS.

We must make certain that 
those we elect to the Presidency, 
the Senate and the House are 
the type who can and will bat­
ten up the doors and windows 
of, plug up the leaks in, and 
sweep away the dirt and rubbish 
from ,our national economy.

Then, after we have hired 
these new hands, let’s keep ever­
lastingly at them to make them 
live up to the high promises 
made in their campaign speeches. 
We must insist that they pare 
the budget, cut taxes, elimate 
waste and corruption, weed out 
unnecessary federal payrollers 
and enact labor legislation fair 
to all. They’ll listen, for after all, 
they are our hired hands—we 
voters are their boss. Having the 
power to hire, we also have the 
power to fire.

Our job will not be finished 
when we hire them by voting 
them in. We will constantly have 
to let them know that they are 
our servants. We must resolve 
now to let our Congressman and 
our two U. S. Senators hear 
from us regularly after we hire 
them, that is, if we. too, would 
like to get back to REING ABLE 
TO SLEEP ON WINDY NIGHTS

The big advantage in having 
more than one child is that they 
climb over each other instead 
of over mom and pop.

TO DATE
WE HAVE FILLED

509.609
Prescriptions

Just as the Doctor Ordered

WATTS BROS.
Gainesville

- ■ *1.

Pigs Will Be Pigs

3 Reasons Why Modern Souls Don’t Find God

Judge, after charging jury: "Is 
there any question you would 
like to ask before considering 
the evidence?"

Juror: “A couple of us would 
like to know if the defendant 
boiled the malt one or two hours 
and how did he keep the yeast
out?”

Labor is that part of the 
human populace which works a 
specified number of hours a 
week for a guarantee sum of 
money. Capital it that part of 
the populace which stays on the 
job after labor goes home and 
worries about how to pay that 
guaranteed amount of money.

AUTHORIZED
DEALER

Sales & Service
FOR

Bendlx Washer 

Crosley Refrigerator 
Domestic Sew Machine 

Estate Range 
Hoffman Television 

Thor Washer 
Coolerator Freezer 

G-E Television

WE SERVICE 
EVERYTHING WE SELL

B O H L S
Hardware Sc Appliances

Gainesville

Since 1884 it’s

Kaden, the Florist
Flowerphone 570 Gainesville

Flowers for 
all Occasions

Represented in Muenster by Mrs. Nick Millar

by Bishop Fulton J. Sheen
GOD IS NOT hard to find. God 

is the most obvious fact of human 
experience. He can be found 
either through the beauty of the 
stars or through the aspirations 
of the heart which, like a sea- 
shell, speak of the ocean of Di­
vinity.

Why is it, then, that so few 
souls come to Him? The fault is 
on our side, not God’s.

The first reason why we do not 
find God our Savior is that we 
want to be saved, but not from 
our sins. We are willing to be 
saved from poverty, from war, 
from ignorance, from disease, 
from economic Insecurity, for 
such types of salvation leave the 
individual whims asid passions 
and sins untouched.

THE SECOND REASON why 
we do not find a Savior ia be­
cause we want to be saved, but 
not at too great a coat. Moat 
souls are afraid of God precisely 
because of His goodness, which 
is dissatisfied with anything that 
is imperfect.

The third reason why we do
not find our Divine Savior Jesus 
Christ is because we want to be 
saved but in our own way, act 
God’s. Very often one hears II 
said that one ought to be free to 
worship God, each.in his own 
way. This is indeed true, inas­
much as it implies freedom of 
conscience and living up to Uie 
lights that God has given to us.

BUT IT CAN be very wrong if 
it means that we worship God in 
our way and not His. What 
would happen to the traffic prob­
lem if we said that the American 
way of life allowed every man to 
drive in traffic in his way and not 
the law’s way; or if patients be­
gan saying to the doctor, “1 want 
to be cured in my own way, but 
not in yours?”

Individuals who say, “I will 
serve God m my way, and you 
serve God »n your way,” ought to 
inquire whether or not it would 
be advisable to serve God in His 
way.

But it is precisely this which 
frightens the modem soul, for if 
his conscience is uneasy he wants 
a religion which 
will leave out hell.
If he has already 
married a g a i n  
against the law of 
Christ, he wants 
a religion that 
does not condemn 
divorce. T h e y  
want to be aav- Bishop Shrew 
ed, not in God’s way, but theirs.

THE SOULS WHO for any one 
of these reasons turn their backs 
on their Savior are not happy. No 
God-less man is happy any more 
than a sightless eye or a deaf ear 
is happy, for as the eye was made 
lor beauty and the ear for har­
mony, so the soul was made for 
God.

Ad*crii**m9m

From where I sit... 6y Joe Marsh

Whitey Sure 
"Rang the Bell

Telephone woke me oot of a sound 
sleep last Friday about eleven- 
thirty. ‘This ia Whitey Fisher out 
on River Road." says a voice. “1 
just wanted to tell you how much 
I like this week's Clarion."

“Thanks, Whitey," I told him 
“But why in blazes call to tell me 
at this time ef night?” “Simple,” 
he says, “your paper boy just de­
livered it a short while ago. Been 
waiting for it all evaning."

Next day, Buzzy Wilson tells me 
ha delivered Whitey’* paper late 
because he stayed for the school 
dance and thought it would be OK

to drop it off on his way home.
From where I sit. I can't blamr 

Whitey for his joke. He wss ju-t 
reminding me we owe other people 
the same respect we expect from 
(hem. Since I’m always talking 
about respecting the other fellow's 
rights—including his right to enjoy 
a glass of beer if he chooses, it was 
only fair that Whitey should “wake 
me up" to hit right to get his copy 
of the Clmrion on time. Thanks 
again, Whitey I

Copyright, 1952, United Slates Brewers Foundation

YOUR COSTS 3 WAYS WITH DODGE TRUCKS
,V JL!m Wei

►

►

►

There's a Dodge truck that's 
"Job-Rafod” to fit your job— 
l/i ton through 4 tons.

Every modal "Job-Rated'— en­
gineered to haul a specific load 
ot I<A*r cost, to last longer, to 
save you money.

Load-carrying and load-moving 
units engineered for proper 
strength and capacity under 
severe conditions.

Ask us fora Show Down of Truck 
Value—bo your own judge. We 
have all the factsl

Come In today for a demonstra­
tion and a good deal.

I Trlm operating costs) You’ll 
get the right “Job-Rated” en­
gine with high compression 
ratio. Features like four rings 

per piston and w ear-resistant 
valves save gas and oil!

* * * * *  W :  m M

"Dodge is by far the
lowest cost to operate!”

“We keep complete individual records of each of our 
trucks and have found that Dodge is by far the lowest 
cost to operate. In fact, our Dodge costs us .6 of a cent 
less per ton-mile to operate than our next closest truck!
1 his difference must be the result of Dodge’s many 
economy features.
“Furthermore, we’ve found that our Dodge ‘Job-Rated: 
truck will haul a full load of sand or gravel .’p hills that 
severa1 of our other^trucks won’t take. Our n„xt truck 
will be a Dodge.”

2 Trim upkoop cost*! You’ll get 
a “Joe-Rated" chassis that’s 
built to stand the gaff. Depend 
on features such as deep-cnan- 

nel frame and high-capacity springs 
to keep repair bills down.

3
V i

j Trim delivery costs! You’ll 
[make more deliveries per day 
J—in less time. I t ’s easy to 
‘wheel a Dodge “Job-Rated" 

truck in and out of tight spots— 
thanks to short turning diameters.

. . . says JOHN 
S. SCOFIELD,
Scofield & Co., 
Freeport, Illinois

Ske. ud foc/oy /br Me 6ez/ 6cy /o /ow-cost /ronsporto/ton...

0 OD GE'UMrRU CK5
F. E. SCH M ITZ M O T O R  C O . 106 N. Chestnut, Gainesville



GRANDFATHER, WHAT A BIG CAR YOU HAD-Appropriately
shy, Deborah Collier, left, 3 4 ,  and Grace Lyons, 4. pose beside the 
overturned car which gave them a wild downhill ride in Boston 
when they accidentally loosened the hand brake. The car. owned 
by Deborah's grandfather, went over a curb, sideswiped a tree, 
knocked down a fence and came to a final halt with its rear end 

high and its front wheels hanging over a 15-foot drop.

FENDING OFF TROUBLEs '
Lady Driver: “Can you fix this 

rear fender so my husband will 
never know I dented it?”

Mechanic: “No, but I can fix 
it so you can ask him in a few 
days how he did it. ”

We give

S & H Green Stamps

For liner 
dry cleaning

try

Tru-Sheen
MILLER'S

Cleaners & Hatters
Gainesville

Boyd & Breeding 
Studio

It Happened  
15 Y ears Ago

Ju n e  25, 1937

Car accident takes life of 
John Haverkamp, 76; aged pio­
neer was walking on road north 
of the city when hit: the tragedy 
was unavoidable. Father Fro- 
win observes 33rd anniversary 
in the priesthood. Bill Hoehn 
breaks arm in fall from tree. 
Mrs. Frank Trachta, Dorothy 
and Harold, return from trip to 
Carlsbad and Old Mexico. Bud 
Swingler has joined the local 
boy scout troop. Mrs. Ray Evans 
left Sunday to attend the bed­
side of her mother, seriously ill 
in Madill. Lillian Fette of Fort

Worth, stewardess for American 
Airlines, spent Sunday here with 
relatives. Mike Fuhrmann family 
goes to San Antonio for investi­
ture of Cecilia Fuhrmann at Our 
Lady of the Lake convent. 
Muenster team makes clean 
sweep in double header softball 
games here against Pilot Point 
and Sherman; Henry Hennigan, 
wielding his south paw, gets 
credit as the winning pitcher.

10 YEARS AGO
June 26. 1942

Microfilm and V mail are in­
troduced to speed letters to ser­
vice men overseas. Local Bap­
tist church conducts 10-day re­
vival. 26,000 pounds of rubber is 
collected here in drive to aid 
war effort. Whaley Mill is sold 
to Kay Kimbell. Camp Howze 
barracks are under construction. 
Rita Felderhoff and Aubrey Jen ­
nings marry. Henry Hennigan 
is recovering from a tonsillect­
omy. The Herbert Meurers move 
into their new home. The Arnold 
Swirczynskis announce the ar­
rival of Sammy. Tire thefts oc­
cur at Weinzapfel and Owen 
homes. Cooke County REA Co­
op is comn#nded for having A-l 
record of repaying loan in ad­
vance of date due. Summer ar­
rived here' Sunday with a blis­
tering 106 degrees. The F. A. 
Kathmans announce the arrival 
of Ronnie. Roman Trachta, army, 
and Ralph Heilman, air corps, 
meet on Angel Island and go to 
see Pvt. Elmer Fette who is re­
covering from an operation in 
San Francisco. Pvt, Arnold Mul­
ler advises homefolks of his safe 
arrival in Ireland.

5 YEARS AGO
June 27. 1947

Mrs. Wm. Wieler, 76. pioneer 
resident passes suddenly Tues­
day after long illness. 3.5 inches 
of rain causes near-crisis in grain 
harvesting. Community flower 
show in parish hall draws 450 
persons. Eddie and Teddie, twin 
boys, bom to the Clarence Hell- 
mans; Teddy lives only five 
hours. J .  B. Wilde starts con­
struction on new Texaco Service 
Station • at intersection of Main 
and IJighway. John Myrick, Lar­
ry Hofbauer, Michael Driever 
and Henry Weinzapfel represent 
Muenster Scouts at Life Saving 
course held at Lake Texoma. 
Virginia Walterscheid has ap­
pendicitis operation. The C. J. 
Bernauers and Mary Faith are 
on a vacation trip to Tennessee, 
Kentucky and other places of 
interest. N o r b e r t Hoedebeck 
joined the personnel at the Mag­
nolia Station Friday. Bill Fuhr- 
man is back at home after serv­
ing with the Merchant Marines 
for two years. Clara Hundt and 
Francis Dieter marry at Lindsay.

Gainesville

2 castor wheels
$emi~Mounted Design

BIFFLE BROTHERS
415 N. Commerce Gainesville

4L E c ltm itty  M o to s i C a .

Blessed Events

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Wilde an­
nounce the birth of a daughter 
Tuesday at 11:45 a.m. at the 
local clinic. Also welcoming the 
eight pound girl are her brother, 
Danny, her sister, Janice, her 
grandparents the J . B. Wildes 
of Muenster and the J o h n  
Schmitzes of Dallas, and her 
paternal great-grandparents, the 
John Eberharts of Muenster.

Mr. and Mrs. Wemer Becker 
are the parents of a daughter 
weighing seven pounds, seven 
ounces, born at Gainesville Sani­
tarium at 12962 a.m. Tuesday. 
Thy have two other children, a 
boy and a girl. The grandparents 
are the Bill Beckers and the Leo 
Rohmers.

OPTOMETRIST 
AVOID EYE STRAIN

DR. H. O. KINNE
Gainesville — :— Texas

for that special

Boyd & Breeding 
Studio

Relatives here have received 
announcement of the birth of a 
nine pound daughter to Mr. and 
Mrs. Virgil Doty of Dallas. She 
is their first child. Mrs. Doty 
is the former Allene Swirczynski, 
daughter of the A1 Swirczynskis 
of Dallas. The little girl’s great 
grandparents are the Joe Swir­
czynskis and Mrs. J .  S. Horn of 
Muenster.

Kewanne Oil Company em­
ployees received word Thursday 
that Ben Hill, retired district 
superintendent of the company, 
had passed away that morning at 
7 o’clock. Funeral service were 
held at Tulsa Friday.

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to take th\m eans of 

expressing our thanks for the 
get-well cards, the gifts, flowers 
a n d  many other kindnesses 
while our little daughter, Kathy, 
was in the hospital.

The M. L. McGowans
■ ■ ... . «

Guests of the Gid Prathers 
and H. J .  Terrys at Bulcher dur­
ing the weekend were Mr. and 
Mrs. Clark Coulter and son, 
David, of Ardmore, Okla., the C. 
H. Greenes of Wichita Falls, Mr. 
and Mrs. Doc Jones of Bowie, 
the Gay Moores and children 
and Mrs. Mattie Jones of Saint 
Jo.

Frigidaire Food Freezer
• New streamlined design
• Finger-touch, counter­

balanced lid
• Built-in lock
• 1 handy, sliding baskets
• Famous Meter-Miser 

mechanism
• Automatic interior light

£ CLIFF McMAHON
Gainesville Gainesville

THE CHRYSLER NEW YORKER 
6-PASSENGER SEDAN 

White M<k--wall lire* at estra cost

WHEN YOU THY POWER STEERING...
HERE’S WHERE TO COJIE FIRST!

You’ve heard about It and read about it. 
Now, if you haven’t felt what Power Steering 
does for you, we invite you to try it first in 
a Chrysler New Yorker . . . where you will 
find full-time (not partial) Power Steering!

What happens is this . . .

You handle the steering wheel in normal 
fashion. But 4/6 of all the work is done for 
you by hydraulic power, constantly at your 
command. Also, you turn the wheel 1/3 lens 
distance now for every maneuver . . . the 
feeling you get of utter control is as wonderful 
as it is new.

Even at a standstill you can turn the wheel 
easily. Now, parking is shorn of its troubles 
(and fatigue I) . . . and you can negotiate 
traffic, awkward drives, and garage doors 
precisely and with ease.

You can double the longest day’s drive you’ve

ever known . . . end up free from arm and 
shoulder strain. Rough roads, soft shoulders, 
snow, mud? , . . the power that helps you 
steer now prevents the car’s wheels from 
“steering back” at ybu. The course you set is 
held, at any speed, till you want it changed. 
Yet, with this 5-times greater control, “wheel 
feel” is always the same.

Why not come try it? Learn for yourself why 
growing thousands of motorists say they’ll 
never be without FulUtime Power Steering 
from now on. Drive a Chrysler . . .  and Learn 
the Difference!

CHRYSLER
THE FINEST CAR
AMERICA HAS YET PRODUCED

BEN SEYLER MOTOR CO. Muenster, Texas



Miss Ruth Hopkins 
And Ray Coe Marry 
Saturday At Krum

Miss Ruth H o p k i n s  and 
Charles Ray Coe e xchanged 
marriage vows in a double ring 
teremony Saturday afternoon at 
4 o’clock in services held in the 
home of the bride’s parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Hopkins in Krum.

The Rev. M. J . Thrift, pastor

Announcing the removal 
oi his oiiice to 

304 E. Main, at Red River
J. Wellington Truitt. DDS

Excellent Food 
Properly Served

CURTIS
RESTAURANTS

East and West California 
Gainesville

of the Krum Baptist church, of­
ficiated at the nuptial ceremony.

For her wedding the bride 
wore a white lace dress with 
floral appliques of Salyna cloth 
on the full skirt and on the 

i  fitted bodice. She wore a small 
white lace hat sprinkled with 
rhinestones and white l a c e  
gloves. Her flowers were an or­
chid corsage.

Attending the couple were Mr. 
and Mrs. Jesse Mitchell.

Mrs. Mitchell wore an aqua 
and brown bemberg sheer dress 
with white accessories and a cor­
sage of pink carnations.

Since they returned from a 
short wedding trip, Mr. and Mrs. 
Coe are making their home here.

She is a graduate of North 
Texas State College at Denton 
with her degree in elementary 
education and is a teacher in the 
Muenster public school.

Mr. Coe. the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. G. T. Coe of Winnsboro, 
graduated from East Texas State 
College at Commerce with a 
major in physical education and 
a master’s degree in education. 
He is a teacher in Muenster High 
school and is also assistant ath­
letic director.

During the summer months 
Coe is operating the Texaco 
Service Station here.

Good Selection of Good

USED TRACTORS and PLOWS
including a few cheap tractors

NEW A C & OLIVER TRACTORS 

JOHNIE WILSON
Gainesville

'Gibson

Keepsake
Itwim HotvMU IrMck

■V

HOUSE PAINT
Get longer life, greater economy — from new  

Sherwin-Williams House Paint! Now this “ Choice 

of leading painters” brings you a smoother, tougher 

coating . . . new, cleaner colors . . .  

new wear and weather resistance!

Community Lumber Company
Roman J. Klement, Mgr. Muenster

PARISIAN “ SKI-REW 8ALLISM ” -  S ’no snow in Part. the*.
warm summer days, so French Olympic ski champion Henri Oresl- 
ler, who is also a singer and composer In a Parisian cabaret, gayly 
"slaloms” down the Champs Elysees on a pair of wheeled skis. 
The apparently unconcerned gendarme gives the impression that 

such stunts are as common in France us in the U. S.

Mary Faith Bemauer 
And Harry Dennis ! 
Say Nuptial Vows j

Mrs. C. J . Bernauer, 213 An­
drews Street, Gainesville, for­
merly of Muenster, has an­
nounced the marriage of her 
daughter, Mary Faith, to Harry 
Dennis, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Olan Dennis of Sivells Bend.

The wedding ceremony was 
solemnized Thursday evening, 
June 19, in Sacred Heart Cathe­
dral rectory in Dallas with the 
Rt. Rev. Msgr. John F. Gulczyn- 
ski officiating.

Following a short wedding 
trip, Mr. and Mrs. Dennis will 
make their home in Hubbard.

The bride graduated from 
Sacred Heart High school in 
Muenster and the groom is a 
graduate of Saint Jo  High school.

DINNER PARTY HONORS 
VISITORS IN LUKE HOME _

Guests for Sunday dinner in 
the Joe Luke home were their 
son. Norman Luke and wife and 
daughter. Karen, of Fort Worth, 
her mother, Mrs. August Friske 
of Ganesville, Mrs. Friske’s sis­
ter. Mrs. Clara Esehberger of 
Robstown, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Michels and six children 
of Munday.

The Michels and Mrs. Esch- 
berger arrived here Saturday. 
The latter went on to Gainesville 
the same day to visit her sister 
remaining in Gainesville until 
Tuesday when she returned 
home by train. The Michels fam­
ily remained through Sunday 
and the Norman Lukes came 
Saturday and stayed until Tues­
day.

Billy Whitt started work last 
Friday at the C. R. Coe Texaco 
Station.

FAMILY GROUP ENJOYS 
PICNIC, OUTING SUNDAY

Visiting Mrs. Wm. Bergman 
i this week are her son. John 

Bergman and his wife and their 
three sons, Roger, Larry and 
John Donald, and the latter s 
fiance. Miss Bettv Meannia, all 
of Mill Valley, Calif. They ar­
rived Saturday. Also arriving 
Saturday and remaining through 
Monday, was Mrs. Bergman's 
daughter, Mrs. Bernard Knoff, of 
Kansas City, who went from 
here to Ardmore to visit rela­
tives.

Sunday Mrs. Bergman and her 
guests and Mr. and Mrs. Herbert 
McDaniel were joined by Mrs. 
Joe Kathman and the Joe Berg­
mans for a picnic dinner at 
Leonard Park in Gainesville. 
Meeting them there were Mrs. 
Wm. Bergman's son and family 
the Sylvester Bergmans of Ard­
more.

After dinner the McDaniels, 
Mrs. Bergman and her guests 
drove to Lake Texoma.

CDA COURT HAS SOCIAL 
IN URBAN ENDRES HOME

Mrs. Val Fuhrman and Mrs. 
Urban Endres were co-hostesses 
for the regular monthly social 
of the Catholic Daughters of 
America, entertaining in the En­
dres home, Tuesday night.

After a progressive 42 series 
the hostesses served pineapple 
parfait piê  topped with whipped 
cream, and iced lemonade to 
those present.

Mrs. Jake Pagel secured the 
galloping prize in the games; 
Mrs. Joe Horn won the high 
score award and Mrs. Paul Fish­
er received the consolation favor.

The Jack Fletchers of Mineral 
Wells spent Monday night and 
Tuesday with his parents, the 
J. W. Fletchers.

MfcU---- n^.
— - i —

Get ALL the

Your Car

Can Deliver!

W e Give S & H Green Stamp*

M agnolia S ervice  Station
Otto Walterscheld Muenster

CONSISTENCY!
One step won’t take you very 

far . . . You’ve got to keep on 
walking; . . . One word won’t tell 
folks who are ... . You’ve got to 
keep on talking.

An inch won’t make you very 
tall . . . You’ve got to keep on 
growing; . , . One little ad won’t 
do it all . . . You’ve got to keep 
them going.

A constant drop of water .T  . 
Wears away the hardest stone. 
. . . By constant gnawing, Towser 
. . . Masticates the toughest bone.

The constant wooing lover . . , 
Carries off the blushing maid; 
. . . And the constant advertiser 
. . . Is the one who gets the trade.

The Pocketbook.

While attending a night club 
with her favorite escort, a young 
woman went to the powder room 
where she met several friends 
she hadn’t seen in ages. The con­
versation was gay and gossipy 
and went on and on.

Then the maid handed her a 
note from her escort. In a bold, 

' male hand were the words:
“Can’t understand why you 
haven’t written."

DR. R. O. BLAGG
Chiropractor Radionics

Colontherapy X-Ray
Calls Made Day or Night 

414 N. Dixon Ph. 544
Gainesville, Texas

NI C K  M I L L E R
Funeral Director

Complete Funeral Service
Phone 26 Muenster

Enjoy your spare time at the

Recreation Club
Games and Snack Bar

Frank (Skinny) Kaiser ,

For All Your Insurance Needs
AUTO . . . FIRE . . . POLIO 

WORKMAN S COMPENSATION 
GENERAL CASUALTY LINES

J. M. Weinzapfel Insurance Agency
Herbert Meurer J. M. Weinzapfel Earl Fisher 

Representing only old line stock companies

g o o d / y e a r

Hurry...Save at thh 
Special Low Price

Famous MARATHON
by G O O D Y E A R

plus tax 
and your 
old tire 

6. 00x16
Here's red hot new* for hot weather 
driven. Now you can get safer new Mara­
thons by Goodyear at this special low 
price of $11.95. It’s still the same Mara­
thon quality noted for ruggedness and 
dependability — a grea^tire value at the 
former price — a sensational buy at this 
special low price!

LO O K  at this special price!

MARATHON snE6>0*,s 
Super-Cushion 

by
g o o o / y e a h ................. .................
Other sizes proportionately low!

SIZE 6.70x15

1395
r 9 L i pl<n ,<> #nJ

------------------------------ r _

Good Prices on 
Goodyear Super 

Sure Grip Tractor Tires

Endres Motor Co
Phone 44 Muenster

TIHfS

T



Get them all... and save!
/ ]/ /  these h/y-car extras are years wM 

the /owest-pr/cecf /ine in its fi'e/cf/

C H E V R O L E T

7 &P Q h t/ fto P  C a K  PRICED SO LOW I

Easy terms if desired

Home and Auto Supply
Gainesville

J. B. Wilde, Chevrolet Dealer
M UENSTER, T E X A S

Lowest priced in its field!
TKIt b*outlfvl n*w Chc.folat I./  A ir liit. for 
•mi thoo any conparoblo inodol in ill field. 
(C ontin u ation  of Ito n da rd  o q u ip n o n l and trim  
llloa tra tod  It dopaadont on  m i U i l i i | r  of  
m alarial.I

F I R E S T O N E  
Home Freezer

Takes less space in the home 
Operates more economically

EXTRA BEAUTY AND QUALITY 
of Body by Fishor

EXTRA SMOOTHNESS of

PO W E R

MORE PEOPLE BUY CHEVROLETS THAN ANY OTHER CAR I

EXTRA WIDE CHOICE 
of Styling and Colon

EXTRA SMOOTH PERFORMANCE 
of Centorpolie Power

EXTRA RIDING COMFORT 
of Improved Knee-Action

Automatic Transmission
A complete power team with 
extra-powerful Valve-in- 
Head engine, and Automatic 

EXTRA STEERING EASE EXTRA PRESTIGE Choke. Optional on De Luxe
of Center-Point Steering of America's Most Popular Car models at extra Cost.

EXTRA STRENGTH AND COMFORT 
oF Fisher Unlsteel Construction

EXTRA STOPPING POWER 
of Jumbo-Drum Brakes

RAY KLEMENTS HOSTS 
FOR FORTY-TWO CLUB

The Forty-Two Club met Sun­
day evening with Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Klement as hosts in their 
home.

Prize winners in the games 
were Carl Schilling, high score, 
and Mrs. Norbert Klement, low 
tally. Mrs. Walter Klement se­
cured the galloping award.

Refreshments were served by 
the hostess to eight couples.

MARYSVILLE WMU MEETS
The Women’s M i s s i o n a r y  

Union of the Marysville Baptist 
church met for a program on 
“Meet the Alaskans”, Tuesday.

Mrs. Lawton Moon, program 
leader, was assisted by Mmes. 
W B. Whitt, Earl Robison, Jess 
Davidson, Marvin Doughty and 
Herman Richey.

Mrs. Richey, vice president, 
conducted the meeting and Mrs. 
Whitt offered the closing prayer.

At birth a kangaroo is only 
about one or two inches long.

DR. A. A. DAVENPORT
CHIROPRACTOR 

X -R A Y  FLUOROSCOPE 

406 Elm St. Gainesville

BEING THOROUGH

in the performance of our du­
ties, we regard no detail, 
however small, as of minor 
significance. Every task, no 
matter how trivial, receives 
our careful attention.

ceo. j.
C a r ro l ]

to SON

You Can't Look 
YOUR BEST—
Unless Your Clothes 
Look Their Beat.

Dyers and 
Hatters

LONE STAR 
CLEANERS

J . P. GOSLIN, Prop. 
Phone 332 Gainesville

THEY'LL HELP COP A BUMPER CROP—En route to Summer County and a bumper Kansas 
wheat crop, a line of combines owned by a Brinsmade, N. D., firm arrives at Lindsborg, Kan. The 
harvest is expected to be the second largest in history, with a predicted yield of 283,704,000 bushels,

an average of 19.8 bushels per acre.

SURPRISE PARTY GREETS 
MRS. RAY OWEN SUNDAY

A surprise party greeted Mrs. 
Ray Owen Sunday afternoon in 
observance of her birthday. Mrs. 
Clem Reiter and Mrs. Jud Boyles 
were hostesses in the former’s 
home.

A pink and blue theme was 
noted in the party rooms and 
guests presented a shower of 
gifts, tied with pink and blue 
ribbons, to the honoree.

The hostesses served refresh­
ment plates of cake and pink 
lemonade. Plate favors were min­
iature pink and blue baskets 
filled with mints.

Twenty guests were present 
and seven who were unable to 
attend sent gifts.

THREE SHARE HONORS 
AT BIRTHDAY PICNIC

A picnic dinner and outing in 
the city park observed Nick 
Stoffel’s birthday Sunday. He 
was 70 years old. Also observing 
birthdays and sharing honors of 
the occasion were his grand­
daughter, Margie Ann Vogel, 
and his daughter-in-law, Mrs. 
Meinrad Stoffels.

Covered dishes, birthday gifts, 
games and visiting made it an 
enjoyable affair.

Present were Messrs, and 
Mmes. Ray Vogel, Andy Truben- 
bach, Lawrence Vogel, Herman 
Stoffels, Albert Stoffels, Frank 
Stoffels and their families. Mrs. 
(Meinrad Stoffels and childten 
and Nick Stoffels.

SHOWER COMPLIMENTS 
VISITOR FROM OKLAHOMA

Mrs. Jess Richey and Mrs. 
J o h n  Richey shared hostess 
duties for a pink and blue 
shower honoring Mrs. Tommy 
Fite of Haileyville, Okla., while

she is visiting her parents, the 
Marvin Doughtys at Marysville. 
Mrs. Fite is the former Vita Mae 
Doughty.

G a m e s  furnished diversion 
and prize Winners, Mmes. Earl 
Robison and Buford Whitt, pre­
sented their awards to the
honoree.

The hostesses entertained in 
the Community Building and 
served refreshments to 15 guests.

SURPRISE PARTY GREETS 
MRS. JOHN SCHILLING

A group of friends gave Mrs. 
John Schilling a surprise party 
in observance of her birthday on 
Thursday, June 19.

The guests arrived in a body 
at the Schilling home with a 
shower of gifts and a white 
gladiola corsage for the honoree. 
After a progressive 42 series re­
freshments of birthday cake and 
ice cream brought by the guests 
were served.

Those present were Misses 
Annie and Mary Becker, Katie 
Hacker and Lizzie Koelzer, Mrs. 
Joe Hacker, Mrs. Frank Kle­
ment, and Mrs. Lena Streng.

Game winners were Mrs. 
Streng. high scor^, Annie Beck­
er, low tally and Mrs. Hacker 
galloping award. They presented 
their prizes to Mrs. Schilling.

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Ro- 
berg, Mr. and Mrs. F. A. Kath- 
man, Mr. and Mrs. Pat Hennigan 
and Andy Yosten left Saturday 
to attend the annual state con 
vention of Veterans of Foreign 
Wars and the Ladies Auxiliary 
in Gaivestion. Betty and Lillian 
Fisher, children of the Paul 
Fishers, accompanied the Kath- 
mans on the trip as far as Hous­
ton where they are visiting 
their uncle and aunt, the Leo 
Appels.

REUNION PARTY OBSERVES 
BIRTHDAYS, ANNIVERSARY

Members of the Horn and 
Schmitz families gathered at 
Leonard Park in Gainesville 
Sunday for a reunion that ob­
served four birthdays and a wed­
ding anniversary.

Jake Horn’s birthday is June 
24, his wife’s and Mrs. Joe 
Horn’s are on the 26, Joe Horn’s 
is on the 30, and the Joe Horns’ 
wedding anniversary occurs on 
June 28.

Those present were Mrs. J. S. 
Horn, Mr. and Mrs. John Schmitz 
of Dallas, Theo Schmitz and 
Theresa Loerwald of Lindsay, 
Mrs. A1 Schad and daughters, 
Clarice, Margaret Mary, and 
Therese of Gainesville, the Ray 
Wildes and children, Danny 
and Janice, the Tony Klements 
and family, the A1 Horns, the 
Joe Horns and daughters, Patsy,

Marilyn and Dianne, and the 
Jake Horns and family of Wind- 
thorst.

A fried chicken dinner, with 
all the trimmings, was followed 
by games and swimming, and 
the day was concluded with the 
serving of ice cream.

The Jake Horns and family ar­
rived Sunday morning to spend 
the day and their daughters, 
Doris Lee and Florine remained 
for a week’s visit with relatives 
here and at Lindsay.

Mr. and Mrs. John Schmitz 
came to Muenster Saturday and 
returned to their home in Dallas 
Sunday night.

The Rudy Heilmans had as 
breakfast guests Friday, Mrs. 
Ivy Thompson and her nephw of 
Conde, S. D. who were enroute 
to San Antonio and McAllen. 
The families are friends since 
Camp Howze days.

IT’S EASY TO FINANCE

Repairs and 
Improvements

Check for these and other es­
sential improvements now.

Gainesville 
Radiator Shop

J. F. "Brownie" Brown 
527 N. Commerce, Gainesville

ADD ROOM 
DECORATING 
FIX FLOORS 

GARAGE 
INSULATION

PAINTING
PLUMBING

RE-ROOFING
WEATHERSTRIP

No cash down payment. Up to 
three years to pay. Come in and 
talk over this plan with us.

This applies also to farm buildings

C. D. Shambarger Lumber Co.
Richard Trachta, Mgr. Muenster



HUNEYCUTT’S
MONEY SAVING

BUY NOW! CASH-EASY TERMS - LAYAWAY!

DIAMOND and HAMILTON
Opens June 26 WATCH SALE Closes Ju ly 2

SAVIN GS to 50%
DIAMOND WEDDING BAND. 5 perfectly 
matched diamonds in a  fish tail setting. 
$500 value. Sale Price $299

1 FULL CARAT DIAMOND SET 7 diamonds 
in this perfectly matched ensemble. $500.00 
value. Choice of white or yellow gold.
Sale Price $299

$350.00 Value 10 DIAMOND WEDDING 
SET. Choice of white or yellow gold.
Sale Price $210

FULL TRADE-IN ALLOWANCE ANY TIME 
EXCEPT DURING SALE, ON A LARGER

DIAMOND.

EASY TERMS — NO EXTRA CHARGE

$200.00 Value. 6 DIAMOND 
WEDDING SET. Choice of 
of white or yellow gold.
Sale Price $120
$150.00 Value 8 DIAMOND 
WEDDING SET. Choice of 
white or yellow gold.
Sale Price $90

$100.00 Value 6 DIAMOND 
YELLOW GOLD WEDDING 
SET. Sale Price $59.95

$75.00 Value 6 DIAMOND 
yellow gold wedding set. 
Sale Price $45

We have purchased one of the 
largest stock of diamonds and 
Hamilton watches in the South, 
which is being liquidated. And 
we bring these SPECIAL VAL­
UES TO GAINESVILLE, at these 
prices during sale time onlyl

FEATURE VALUE!
FOR THE YOUNG LADY! A genuine dia­
mond mounted in 14 carat solid gold. 
Sale Price $5.98
(Full trade-in allowance at any time on a  
larger diamond.)

$600 Value Wedding Set. 8 
D i a m o n d s  a ttra c tiv e ly  
mounted in a  combination 
of white and yellow gold. 

Sale P r i c e __________ $325

$50.00 Value 1 DIAMOND 
yellow gold wedding set. 
Sale Price „ _ $29.95
$25.00 Value 1 DIAMOND 
yellow gold wedding set. 
Sale price _ $14.95

$200.00 
DIAMOND 

WEDDING BAND
5 Diamonds. White or yel­
low gold.
Sale Price $120

FEATURE VALUE
46 DIAMOND PLATIN­
UM WEDDING SET! One 
o f the finest diamonds 
ever found. Engagement 
ring has 16 round and 2 
marquise diamonds. The 
matching wedding band 
has 22 round & 3 mar­
quise diamonds. $2100 
value.
Sale Price $1450

1.20 Carat DIAMOND WEDDING BAND
$600.00 Value Sale Price . $337.50
WEDDING BAND 5 DIAMONDS set in
Platinum. $400.00 value.
Sale Price $240
WEDDING BAND $300.00 Value. 5 DIA­
MONDS set in white or yellow gold.
Sale $175.95

$400.00 Value
27 DIAMOND WHITE GOLD WEDDING 
SET
Sale Price $199

$1500.00 Value LADIES' PLATINUM DIA­
MOND RING containing 17 perfectly 
matched diamonds. Total weight 1.17 
carats. Sale Price $895
$2000.00 Value LADIES' DIAMOND RING. 
5 Diamonds. Total weight 1.88 carat.
Sale Price $999

FEATURE VALUE
Over Vi Carat WEDDING 
SET. 7 Diamonds, per­
fectly m a t c h e d  and 
beautifully set in white 
gold $239

$150.00 Value. WEDDING BAND. 5 DIA­
MONDS, white or yellow gold.
Sale Price $89.95

$100.00 DIAMOND WEDDING BAND. 5 Dia­
monds. Sale Price ... . . .  .... $59.95

$75.00 DIAMOND WEDDING BAND. 
Sale P r ice ... ........................... ... $45

MEN S DIAMOND RINGS
MAN'S DIAMOND RING. 
1V2 Carat. Extra fine.
Sale Price $1195
MAN'S DIAMOND RING 
in a  massive mounting. 
Large center stone sur­
rounded by 6 small stones. 
Weight 2.30 carat.
Sale Price $1595

MAN'S DIAMOND RING. 
Fine 3A Center Diamond. 
Sale Price. $399
MAN'S DIAMOND RING. 
1 Carat Massive Mounting. 
Extra Fine Stone.
Sale Price $499
MAN'S $125.00 DIAMOND 
RING. Sale P rice .... . $69.95

HAMILTON WATCHES
First time offered at a  Special 
Di scount .  One of America's 
Finest Watches. Nationally ad­
vertised. Your choice of many 
styles in both Men's and Ladies.

NOW 25%  DISCOUNT

HAMILTON RAILROAD WATCH 992 21 Jewel 
Yellow Gold $71.50 value $53.62

$62.50 Value 17-Jewel Water Resistant HAM­
ILTON WRIST WATCH
Now ........    $46.87

DIAMOND WATCH BAND contains 32 full cut 
Diamonds. $850.00 Value.
Sale Price ...................  $495

LADIES
$71.50 Values ..............Now $53.62
$69.50 Values Now $52.42
2 Diamond $137.50 Value ......—

$67.50 Values ........_  Now $50.62
$57.75 Values Now $43.21
$55.00 Values Now $41.25
$52.25 Values ______  Now $39.19

........ .........     Now $102.13

YOU CAN BUY WITH CONFIDENCE AT

HUNEYCUTT'S
"GAINESVILLE'S FRIENDLY JEWELRY STORE"

112 NORTH COMMERCE

FEATURE VALUE
LADIES' DIAMOND HAM­
ILTON WATCH has 1 full 
carat diamonds beautifully 
set in white gold. $795 
value. A real diamond 
buy __________ _______  $395

FEATURE VALUE
DIAMOND SET HAMILTON
Watch with diamond 
attached. Contains 42 
monds. $695.00 value. 
Sale Price . . .

band
dia-

$399



PAGE NINE
W o m a n ,  explaining traffic- 

crash to a policeman: “—and 
then I very clearly signalled that 
I had changed my mind. ”

Joe “And how was the bur­
lesque dance?’’

Poe “Abdominal!”

Your l  ocal USED-COW Dealer 

Removes

D ead

S t o c k

C EN T R A L H IDE & 
REN D ERIN G  CO .

For Immediate Service

P h o n e  C o l l e c t  

No. 6
Gainesville, Texas

WHEEL OF TORTURE-At a
speed of 135-miles-per-hour a 
new high-speed tire developed 
by Goodrich engineers pulls 
away from the simulated road 
faster than inside pressure can 
restore the rubber to its original 
shape. The grueling test would 
tear an ordinary tire apart, but 
the new one is said to be able to 
withstand hundreds of miles of 
sustained high speed driving. 
Photo was made at l/10,000th 

of a second.

Charming Child 
of the Week
Photographed by 
Kent Bellah Studio, 

Saint Jo,

. .  .is lovely blonde Linda, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
James Cain . . . Children 
enjoy having their pic­
tures made at. . .

KENT BELLAH STUDIO
Saint Jo

KEEP COMING
In season and out of season 

we'll save you time and money 
on your farm implement repairs.

Pipe, pipe fittings, sucker rods, 

working barrels for water wells

Machine Shop & Supply Co.
Louis & Lawrence Roberg Jerome Pa gel

tY h y /f/c k corn
b y  b a n c /?

v . . , 

" M

DEARBORN- 
WOOD BROS.
CORN HARVESTER

saves backs, rime and money
• This Corn Harvester ran be 
handled easily by the Ford Trac­
tor, or any 2-plow tractor with 
standard A.S.A.E. power take-off.

Unique rotary snapping bar 
reduces shelling and helps clear 
trash. Entire harvester tilts for­
ward or back for tall or short corn

T R A C T OR

Three gathering chains really 
keep the corn moving. Ample 
capacity elevator delivers corn 
to front or rear of wagon. Blower 
Is standard equipment. For easier, 
more profitable corn picking, 
investigate the Dearborn-Wood 
Bros. Com Harvester nowl

Tractor Sales and Service
Hugh “Cotton” Jackson

urrmtm m. otimom mron c»kmmtmk
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WANT ADS

EASES THE PANE PA!N*~Confronted with a 24-story glass and 
stainlesc steel building, the designers of the new Lever Brothers’ 
building in New York decided to install a special elevator to solve 
the window-washing problem. The trolley, above, runs on tracks 
around the periphery of the roof and from it the elevator is lowered 

to the desired level.

Soil Conservation 
Notes

Vetch began playing its role 
as a cash crop last week when 
cooperators of the Upper Elm- 
Red Soil Conservation district 
began harvesting their vetch 
acreage. Vetch is a multi-pur­
pose crop serving as a soil im­
proving legume crop, a winter 
cover crop, a winter and early 
spring grazing crop, a honey 
crop—and the seed is harvested 
to produce a cash crop. With a 
threatened short vetch seed sup­
ply looming big on the horizon 
many vetch growers are taking 
special pains to get the elusive 
seed in the hoppers of combines 
thus year, according to Emmitt 
Yoder, technician of the Muens- 
ter work unit.

W. H. Enrires is in the midst of 
combining 20 acres of vetch on 
his farm northwest of Muenster. 
A1 Wiesman reports 30 bushels 
of vetch and rye from about 3 
acres. Clifford Hudspeth of For- 
estburg combined an average of 
300 pounds of vetch per acre 
from 15 acres on Clear Creek. 
Ike Fulton of Myra has just fin­
ished combining 25 acres of 
vetch and barley but will not 
know his vetch yield until the 
seed is separated.

Range, pasture and meadow 
improvement p r a c t i c e s  have 
been started on many ranches 
and farms in the Muenster. area. 
All grasses and legumes improve 
only when they are allowed to 
grow leaf area. No plant can 
long survive if the top is re­
peatedly taken off by grazing 
or cutting. So the only way to 
improve range a n d  pasture 
grasses is to manage them so 
that they are given an oppor­
tunity to grow and build up 
root reserve and produce seed 
so that old plants can be replaced 
by new, vigorous seedlings. The 
good grass-manager will fake 
half and leave half of each years 
growth. The part that is left is 
not lost. It is returned to the

soil first as a protective litter 
to conserve moisture, prevent 
erosion and to reduce soil tem­
peratures; later this litter is in­
corporated into the soil as or­
ganic matter to further promote 
the growth of grasses.

In this area the tall range 
grasses will get a good growth 
and a chance to produce seed if 
stock Is taken off in June and 
kept off until fmst. After frost 
the grass serves as dry forage to 
winter the cattle and very little 
hay is ever needed when enough 
grass is so managed.

Many land-owners have recog­
nized the need for grass im­
provement and are setting up 
grazing rotations to allow a rest 
period for a portion of their 
grassland. Clover and Johnson 
grass fields are being wildely 
used to allow pasture to rest. 
Some of the farmers and 
ranchers who are using rotations 
and supplemental pastures and 
are deferring some of their grass 
to allow it to grow and improve 
include J . H. Fields and Jim  
Embry. Dangelmayr Brothers, 
Dick Harris, R C. Redman. 
Grady McElreath. Rafe McEl- 
reath. H. B. Perryman, and on 
the Luce and Hudspeth ranches.

Ray Sicking is constructing a 
mile of field terraces on his farm 
near Myra using his tractor and 
three-disc plow. He is using the 
island method in constructing 
the terraces and SCS personnel 
of the Muenster W oTk Unit are 
assisting in the work. Sicking 
has already built several broad 
easy-to-cross field terraces using 
this method.

An important feature about the 
terrace construction work that is 
now underway on the Sicking 
farm is that the terraces empty 
onto a well established Bermuda 
grass waterway that was sodded 
two years ago for this purpose. 
When completed the terraces 
will offer protection against ero­
sion on the cropland and will 
afford contour farming, all of 
which is a part of the coordinated 
conservation plan that Sicking is 
carrying out on his entire farm 
as a cooperator with the Upper- 
Elm-Red Conservation District.

Electric Fans
Cool summer breeze 
at low cost.

8 to 16 inch sizes

Stationary and 
oscillating

Other Hot Weather Needs
Thermos bottles, Thermos jugs 

picnic ice boxes

Waples Painter Company
Muenster ,

GOOD HOUSE in Lindsay for 
sale or trade. Write Rosa 
Mitchell, Gen. Del., Healdton, 
Okla., or see J . B. Wilde, Muens­
ter. 32-6p

ELECTRIC FANS Oscillating 
or stationary. 10, 12, 16, inch
sizes. Community Lumber Co.

32 tf.

FOR SALE: New model 3 disc 
McCormick Deering plow; Bar­
gain. H Farmall Tractor, M. 
Farmall Tractor, Ford Tractor, 
also other plows and one ways. 
Lawrence Zimmerer, Gainesville 
and Era highway, phone 1864- 
J-2. 82 2
• * ' ......... .... .............-J" ■ ’ — — - " ■ —

FOR SALE Muenster city lots 
ideal for resident and business 
location. Level and deep soil. 
$200 a lot. Not less than 2 for 
sale. See George Gehrig. 32-1

20% Discount on new ’51 model 
Servel refrigerators and new ’51 
model International food free­
zers. Enderby Butane Ga s ,  
Gainesville 31-1

FOR SALE 4 used electric re­
frigerators. All in good condi­
tion. Enderby Butane Ga s .
Gainesville - 31-1

1386 ACRES FOR SALE. 886 
acres in grass. 4 sets of improve­
ments, plenty of water. Bell and 
Beck, Gainesville 31-3

USED IRON and parts of all 
kinds. Half price. J .  P. Flusche.

BARGAINS IN 
FARM MACHINERY

51 Ford tractor
VC Case tractor 

New Dearborn mower 
Case baler, A-l condition 

late model
WILDE IMPLEMENTS

Gainesville

FIFTY SEVEN CENTS
We want you to know about 

our fine goods and low prices. 
We buy in great guantities, own 
our buildings, and do all our 
work, so have less expense and 
do save you money on every 
ourchase.

Buy $3 worth of other goods 
and get, for just 57 cents, a 3 
pound can of Crisco.

We have a full car load of pure 
cane sugar and, with $8 worth 
of groceries, will sell you 100 
pounds sugar for $7.85.

Big shipment fine orange 
slices, 5 pounds, 51 cents. Full 
quart Texas Julep only 10 cents, 
regular 25 cents . . .  a nice soft 
drink.

Bring this ad and get a half 
pound of Mint Melodies Free. 

OWEN SAUNDERS
Gainesville 31-3

INSURANCE SERVICE
Auto — Life — House 

Sales, Adjustments, Repairs 
Financing

Ray Wilde Muenster 34-tf

New M-M Equipment
Tractors, combines, balers 

Mowers, rakes 
New Bearcat Hammermill 

New Ford Mower 
Wisconsin motors for 
balers and combines 

WILDE IMPLEMENTS
Gainesville - 26-1

RADIO AND Television Re­
pairs, car radios a specialty. See 
Moore Radio Repair at Wolf 
Barber Shop. 27-1

FOR SALE: John Deere wire 
for automatic self tying balers. 
Shamburger Lumber Co. 26-1

CHICKS. Our last chick hatch 
was May 19, but we still have 
some sturdy started chicks. Bet­
ter get some of these premium 
quality started White Leghorn 
pullets. Call us today, Phone 63. 
Muenster Hatchery 28-1

GET YOUR frozen food pack­
aging materials at Enderby Bu­
tane Gas, Gainesville. 19-tf

Dirt Work of AU Kinds
See us for tanks, terraces and 

any kind ol dirt work. We have 
the right equipment to give you 
a good job and a good deal on 
any kind of earth moving.

GILBERT ENDRES 45tf

USED INNER TUBES
Are Still Available, 25c up, at 

BEN SEYLER MOTOR CO.
IN THE MARKET for Junk Iron 

of all kinds. Have lota of good 
used truck parts. J. P. Flusche, 
Muenster. 50-tf.

REMEMBER! If It's a welding 
or metal repair Job you can have 
It done at the Muenster Machine 
Shop. 18-tf

FOR SPECIAL orders of Fin­
ney’s fine bread, cakes and pas­
tries, see or phone Wimpy Kath- 
imn, Ph. 95-W. 52-tf.

S I N G E R  
Sewing Machine Co.

Gainesville, Texas 
Has _a sales and service man in 
the Muenster vicinity each Wed­
nesday. Mail a card or call 1223 
Gainesville or Jimmy’s Service 
Station, Muenster. 18tf

FOR laundry and dry clean­
ing pick-up and delivery service 
phone your Robran Laundry 
representative. Main Cafe, Ph. 
51, Muenster. * 25-tf

WATCH REPAIRINC. We check 
all work with the electronic tim­
ing machine. Huneycutt Jewelry. 
Gainesville. 37-ttf

GOODYEAR TIRES are avail­
able at Endres Motor Co. Over 
300 sizes of car, truck, tractor 
and implement tires. 30tf

GLASS
Plate, window, automobile, fur­
niture tops, mirrors. Old mirrors 
resilvered. For complete glass 
service call Gainesville Glass 
Shop. Ph. 910, 311 N. Chestnut

Waitress: “Tea or coffee?” 
Customer: “Coffee, please.

Without cream.”
Waitress: “You’ll have to take 

it without milk. We haven't any 
cream.”

Tourist: “Did you see a pe­
destrian pass here?”

Native: “Nope. Been sittin’ 
here all day and ain’t nothing 
passed but one man and he was 
walkin’.”

You Gain 
Two Ways

When You Sell Here
Our prices are higher

We make a  habit of beating the 
current livestock market. Check 
our prices at any sale and see 
for yourself.

Selling expense is lower
Y ou  p a y  l e s s  commission. 
Shrinkage loss is lower. Hauling 
cost is lower.

Your best livestock market 
is here in Muenster

Muenster Livestock Auction
DICK CAIN Owner and Auctioneer



Lindsay News

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Kenny 
of Detroit, Miss., were guests in 
the Theo Schmitz home last 
week Wednesday through Sat­
urday. They had been in Dallas 
the earlier part of the week.

Sgt. and Mrs. Roy Lee Zwinggi 
of Fort Worth announce the 
bjft.h of twin daughters Wednes­
day, June 19 at Carswell AFB 
hospital. The babies, named 
Debra and Denise, are the grand­
daughters of the John Corcorans 
of Gainesville and Leo Zwinggi 
of Lindsay. John Herr of Deni­
son, formerly of Muenster, is the 
great grandfather. Mrs. Zwinggi 
is the former Charlotte Corcoran.

Kenneth Zwinggi left Sunday 
by car on a trip to Colorado.

the 4tb

. . .  in comfortable, good looking sports togs from 
the man's store. Nationally advertised brands, of 
course. Famous for good fit and long wear.

SLACKS by Reeves. Sanforized 
woven blue denim, combining 
the appearance of dress clothes 
&nd the ruggedness of work 
clothes.
SPORT SHIRTS by McGregor. 
Swell selection of patterns and 
fabrics.

*7/ieMANHATTAN Glatltiend.
N ational Brand* are your a isu ra n ce  ol quality

G ainesville

Miss Marcella Hermes, who is 
staying in Muenster with the 
Ray Wildes, joined her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Julius Hermes on
a trip to sherman Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Green and 
family have moved back to Lind­
say after living in California for 
several years. They are at home 
in Mrs. Joe Bezner’s house from 
which the Herbert Hundt family 
moved recently. The Hundts are 
n o w  occupying the former 
Phillips house.

Mr. and Mrs. H. S. Fuhrmann, 
La Vern Fuhrmann, Mrs. Da- 
mond Fuhrmann and daughter, 
Elaine, and Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Hess and son, Tommy of Muens­
ter, were in San Antonio Satur­
day through Monday. On Sun­
day they attended ceremonies in 
which their daughter and s ister, 
Sister Catherine Henry, made 
her profession and received her 
ring. She is a member of the 
Sisters of Divine Providence at 
Our Lady of the Lake Convent. 
Also attending the services was 
Rev. Joseph Fuhrmann of Cor­
pus Christi, who was celebrant 
of the Mass.

Little Darlene Hess of Muens­
ter spent the weekend here with 
her great uncle and aunt, Mr. 
and Mrs. Phillip Metzler.

Mr. and Mrs. Jake Bezner and 
son, Weldon, and Mrs. I. A. 
Zimmerer left for San Antonio 
Saturday to attend religious 
ceremonies at Our Lady of the 
Lake Convent The Bezners’ 
daughter. Sister Anna Rose, 
made her perpetual profession. 
Mrs. Zimmerer’s visit was a sur­
prise for her daughter. Sister 
Dorothy Theresa, who arrived 
in San Antonio Saturday from 
San Fernando, Calif., where she 
was a teacher during the past 
school term.

Members of Mrs. Joe Bezner's 
family gathered for a supper 
party Sunday in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bezner Jr . 
The party honored the Bob 

j  Youngs and son, Jimmy, of Dal- 
i las, Mrs Isabel Galvan, Mrs. Er- 
I nest Garcia and son, Ernie of 

San Antonio. Sharing host du­
ties were Mrs. Joe Bezner and 
the B r u n o  Zimmerers who 
brought covered dishes for the 
supper.

Ice
Cream

All the popular flavors. Pint to gallon sizes. Also a  good 
selection of 5c and 10c ice cream novelties.

Other warm weather favorites
T E A  SQ PA WATER KOOL-AID

All popular 
brands. Some 
with free iced 
tea glasses.

By the carton or 
the case. All 

popular flavors.

Just add sugar 
and ice water. 
Choice of six 

flavors.

Something new . . .
Py-O-My Angel Food Cake Mix

Just add whites of 2 eggs and water. Mix includes all 
other ingredients. Weight 11 % oz. Price 55c.

INTRODUCTORY OFFER Cake pan free with 2 pack­
ages of Angel Food Cake Mix.

• ♦

The FMA Store
v

Muenster, Texas

Giant Speedometer Cuts Accidents

To make motorixta conscious of speed limits, the Seattle, Wash, 
police department has put into operation a 1‘owerglide Chevrolet with 
a precise speed clock mounted at the rear. Flashing red and amber 
lights on the giant exterior dial reflect the speed recorded by the car's 
speedometer. Police drive the car around the city an average of 90 
mtltas a day and report it has reduced accidents appreciably. Two-way 
radio and a loudspeaker system to caution drivers are included.

Rev. Vincent Orth of Subiaco, 
Ark., is spending this week in 
Lindsay with relatives.

' Mr. and Mrs. Bob Young and 
son, Jimmy, of Dallas were Sun­
day guests of her mother, Mrs. 
Joe Bezner. When they returned 
home in the evening they were 
accompanied by Mrs. Young’s 
sister, Mrs. Isabel Galvan, her 
daughter, Mrs. Ernest Garcia and 
little son, Ernie, of San Antonio, 
who had been visiting here and 
will return to their homes from 
Dallas.

MRS. CHARLES PLATTE 
PASSES AWAY TUESDAY

Mrs. Charles Platte, sister of 
H. J .  and Adolph Fuhrman, 
passed away Tuesday in a hos­
pital in Dodge City, Iowa, where 
she had been a patient for 11 
weeks. Funeral services were 
held at SL Joseph, Iowa, Thurs­
day.

H. J .  Fuhrman. who spent 
three weeks at his sister’s bed­
side, returned home Tuesday 
morning and at noon received 
the message telling of her death.

The deceased is survived by 
three sons and a number of 
brothers and sisters in addition 
to H. J .  and Adolph Fuhrman.

A POSSIBILITY!
Many a man thinks he has a 

clear conscience, when he has 
only a poor memory.

BE CAREFUL
Irate salesgirl to disagree­

able customer: “Go easy, madam. 
The days when I used to insult 
customers are still fresh in my 
mind.”

“Who was the blonde you 
were out with Wednesday and 
Thursday?”

“Oh, she’s the brunette I was 
out with Monday and Tuesday.”

HOW TO SUCCEED
Rex Beach, when asked to 

what he attributed his success, 
replied:

“I can best answer that by tell­
ing the story of the Swede in 
Alaska.

“He was the owner of several 
rich mines, and all of his triends 
wondered how he managed to 
become to successful.

“One night one of them asked 
him.

“ ‘Ay never told nobody be­
fore’ ,he said. ‘But ‘Ay vill tell 
you. Ay-yust kept diggin’ holes’.”

in Gainesville

TEXAS
Saint Jo, Texas

Week Nites
Saturday __
Sunday ___
Adults 35c

_______ 7:30
2:00

______ .. 3:30
Children 12c

Catching Up With Trouble
Chasing a woman is fun. The 

trouble begins when you catch 
her.

Fri.-Sal., June 27-28

Wild Bill Elliott

"WACO"

Sat. Nite Prev. 
Sun.-Mon.. June 29-30

Gene Kelly 
Donald O’ Connor 
Debbie Reynolds
fffl* _e t mSmgin in 
The Rain"

Tues. Only—July 1

Johnny Weissmuller

'Jungle Manhunt'

Wed.-Thurs., July 2-3

Allan Ladd 
Lizabeth Scott #

"Red Mountain"

Fri.-Sat.

Sterling Hayden 
Forrest Tucker

FLAMING FEATHER"

Sat. Prev. 11:15 P. M. 
Sun.- Mon- Tue.

Kirk Douglas 
Patricia Wyrriore

"The BIG TREES"

Wed.-Thurs

Elizabeth Taylor 
Larry Parks

"LOVE IS BETTER 
THAN EVER"

in Gainesville

Thurs.- FrL- Sat.

John Calvert 
Ralph Morgan

"GOLD FEVER"
PLUS

Charles Starred 
Smiley Burnett

SMOKY CANYON"

Sun.- Mon.

Wild Bill Elliott 
Pamela Blake

"W  A C O"

Tue*.-Wed.

Gene Barry 
Lydia Clarke

'ATOMIC CITY"

Did you ever
buy a  tire guaranteed against any and 
all road hazards . . .  even running flat?

That’s exactly what Gates says and does!
AND SO DOES BEN!

If you have a  puncture and can't stop in time, don't 
let it worry you. No matter how you ruin your tire we 
make adjustment on the spot for the unused wear in 
your tire . . . NO QUESTIONS ASKED. Come in and 
see for yourself. '  ,

Also see our 6:00 x 16 tire, only $12.45

Ben Seyler Motor Co.
Muenster, Texas


