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A program thal deserves
widespread local support is 
the current effort to establish 
a men’s civic organization 
working for the welfare of 
Muenster and its surround­
ing area. Without such a group 
it is impossible for our com­
munity on any other to ac­
quire the coordination and en­
thusiasm needed for ' worth 
while accomplishment.

We realize of course that 
much can be done for the 
public welfare through the 
isolated efforts of individuals. 
The person who establishes a 
service or business does some­
thing toward the welfare of 
his area. But some projects 
are too big for individuals to 
handle. Others are overlooked 
because everybody’s business 
is nobody’s business. Those 
are the projects which require 
the unity of purpose and the 
cooperation that are possible 
only through organigation.

A convenient example is 
before us at this very time. 
Most of us would like to see 
some expression of community 
pride in our Christmas dec­
orating program. Perhaps a 
contest to inspire special ef­
forts. Perhaps a coordinated 
plan to emphasize a certain 
theme of the Christmas story. 
Perhaps some sort of com­
munity display. But nothing 
is being done about it because 
there is no organized civic 
group to take charge.

Indications now are that a 
far more important project 
looms as a community need. 
Since the death of Doctor 
Myrick a few public spirited 
citizens have assumed the 
task of seeking a doctor to 
succeed him. And they are 
finding that no one so far has 
shown an interest in settling 
in a town that has no hospital. 
It’s beginning to seem that 
Muenster will not have a 
resident doctor unless it has 
a hospital.

Here’s a circumstance that 
challenges us to get going on 
an idea that most of us have 
favored all along. We have 
been convinced that Muen­
ster could benefit wonderful­
ly from a well equipped and 
well staffed local hospital. But 
we did nothing about it be­
cause we were getting by on 
the limited service of one 
overworked man who had in­
adequate facilities for his 
serious cases. Now even that 
limited service is no longer 
available.

Necessity prompts us to give
serious thought to this matter. 
Apparently we will not get 
to settle for half-way meas­
ures. The sign is that we will 
have to go all the way or 
continue being the medical 
orphans we are today. We are 
faced with providing a hos­
pital, after which we can get 
a staff of doctors . . .  in other 
words, more complete medical 
service than ever before, or 
none at all.

Plainly a project like this 
is not one for individuals to 
take on. It requires lots of 
work and enthusiasm. It can 
be undertaken only by a group 
of men working together for 
community welfare and striv­
ing for community wide sup­
port.

This isn’t saying that Thurs­
day n i g h t ’ s organizational 
meeting will launch a hospital 
project, nor any other specific 
project. But it is intended to 
form a civic group willing and 
able to tackle such projects 
. . . a group with the civic 
spirit and pride to plan and 
work for a better Muenster. 
Anyone willing to help to­
ward that cause will be 
warmly welcomed.

Very likely to be contested 
in the state’s courts is that 
provision of the new insur­
ance law stating that a per­
son’s insurance rate can be 
penalized for his traffic viola­
tions during the past three 
years.

The law has a double pur­
pose. To encourage safe driv­
ing by giving a reduced rate 
to persons with a good driv­
ing record and also to shift 
the greater insurance burden 
on the persons who are caus­
ing the insurance losses. From 
that standpoint the law seems 
both fair and practical.

Bui in assessing penalties 
to violations committed before 
the law was passed it appears 
to be in conflict with old 
time standards of justice . . . 
that a person cannot be 
charged with violating a law 
before it was passed. For in­
stance, if a law is passed to­
morrow setting a speed limit 
of 30 miles per hour on a 
certain street, a driver cannot 
be charged “with exceeding 

(Continued on page 8)

Dinner Meeting 
Set to Organize 
Men’s Civic Club

A civic organization to func­
tion somewhat like a chamber 
of commerce is the objective 
of a dinner meeting to be held 
Thursday night in Rohmer’s 
Restaurant.

When announcing the event 
last week J. M. Weinzapfel 
suggested a n organization 
somewhat similar to the Com­
munity Council which used to 
be active here. When that 
group was formed it picked 
a name suggestive of the en­
tire area’s interests rather 
than just business interests, 
hence its preference of Com­
munity Council rather than 
Chamber of Commerce. At 
that time rural people were 
encouraged to join, and it is 
hoped thal several .o f  them 
will also join the new organ­
ization.

Whatever the decision re­
garding purpose and name the 
new organization will get its 
start from three former organ­
izations that have faded out 
but left funds in the bank. 
That money will provide the 
kick-off dinner.

Local business heads along 
with a number of other good 
prospects for active member­
ship are urged to attend.

2 Package Stores 
Begin Operation,
2 More Due Soon

Two more new business 
firms, both liquor stores, were 
established here during the 
past week. This gives Muen­
ster three package stores in 
operation and two more due 
to start soon.

C.J. Kaiser and Tony Koes- 
ler are co-owners of K Cut 
Rate Liquors, which was 
opened last Friday at the 
corner of Highway 82 and 
Hickory.

Loxley Cochran of Gaines­
ville is owner of the City 
Liquor Store at 223 North 
Main, the location formerly 
occupied by Wiese Jewelry. 
He too opened his business 
last Friday.

Carl Walterscheid is the old 
timer in the local liquor trade. 
His 82 Liquors, one location 
east of the Magnolia Station 
on Highway 82, has been open 
since the last week of October.

Alvin “Red” Loerwald of 
Lindsay seems to be next in 
line to get established. He has 
the former Ace Cafe building 
on the Highway, remodeled 
and ready for stocking as soon 
as he receives his license.

A new building now under 
construction at the east city 
limit, north of the highway, 
should be ready for occupancy 
about the first of the year. J. 
B. Wilde is building it for 
eventual use as a used car 
office in connection with a 
Chevrolet Agency headquar­
ters building on the adjoining 
location. Until the larger 
building is finished it will be 
leased as a package store. So 
far no one has applied for a 
license to operate it.

Christmas Pageant 
Slated at Lindsay

Students of Lindsay School 
are ready to go on the stage 
with their Christmas Pageant 
and Yule program in which 
all the children participate. 
Sister Liberta has supervised 
rehearsals.

Everyone is invited to at­
tend the program Sunday, 
Dec. 6, in the Parish Hall. 
Curtain time is 7:30 p.m.

On S u n d a y  afternoon, 
December 6, from 2 until 5 
p.m. members of the Gaines­
ville College Ex-Student As­
sociation will be hosts for an 
open house at Gainesville Col­
lege.

Pres. W a r r e n  Flowers, 
speaking for the association, 
urges that everyone in Cooke 
County avail himself of the 
opportunity to come to the 
campus on Highway 51 for a 
visit through the newly oc­
cupied building which is lo­
cated on Blacks Hill.

In the classroom and lab­
oratory areas, he may meet 
and visit with the teachers 
of the college and learn what 
he wishes to know of the col­
lege, its work and its ex­
panded quarters.

In the student lounge and 
the foyer guests will be met 
by the administrative officers, 
the members of the Ex-Stu­
dents Association and student 
hosts and hostesses for a so­
cial hour or for conducted

City Library Adds 
New Encyclopedia

Muenster City Library has 
been enriched by the addition 
of a new and complete set bf 
Encyclopedia Brittanica, a gift 
from Muenster State Bank. 
With the encyclopedia vol­
umes comes ten classics for 
children, language dictionaries 
in English-German and like­
wise in French, Spanish, Ital­
ian, Swedish and Yiddish, and 
a large atlas.

Two other books of fiction 
were added this week: The 
Trapp Family on Wheels by 
Maria Augusta Trapp, and 
Gusty’s Child by A. T Hobart.

Members of the local court 
Catholic Daughters of Amer­
ica, sponsors of the library, 
are on duty Wednesday each 
week from 9:30 to 5 and in­
vite anyone interested to stop 
in to visit and to select books 
for reading.

Gainesville KCs 
To Host Initiation 
For 2 Districts

About forty candidates, in­
cluding five from Muenster, 
will be admitted to the 
Knights of Columbus next 
Sunday at an initiation to be 
hosted by the Gainesville 
council. It will be a joint in­
itiation for Districts 6 and 47, 
which used to be combined in 
one district. Councils repre­
sented are Muenster, Gaines­
ville and Denton in District 
47 and Dension, Sherman and 
Pilot Point in District 6.

The initiation begins Thurs­
day night when the Denison 
council will be host for first 
degree ceremonies.

Sunday’s program begins at 
8 a.m. with group attendance 
of members and candidates at 
mass in St. Mary’s church and 
communion breakfast in the 
St. Mary’s lunch room.

Second and third degrees in 
the Gainesville KC hall are 
scheduled to begin at 10 
o’clock. After initiation a 
Dutch lunch will be served 
in the council’s club room.

Marian Program 
Features Film on 
Fatima Message

A Marian program present­
ing the message of Fatima and 
related stories will be pre­
sented in the Sacred Heart 
High School gym Tuesday 
night, Dec. 8, at 8:15.

The talking movie is being 
brought h e r e  by Marion 
Chudy of Subiaco, Ark. who 
formerly toured with a Fati­
ma group but now devotes 
his time to showing the film. 
It will not be shown else­
where in this area on this trip. 
No admission is charged.

SH Alumni Slates 
Holiday Social

Sacred Heart Alumni mem­
bers made plans for their an­
nual holiday party, a dinner- 
dance to be held December 
27, when they had a business 
meeting Tuesday night. Fur­
ther details of the event are 
being worked out by a com­
mittee. *

In other business the group 
planned participation in a 
volleyball tournament, de­
tails for that event also to 
be announced when arrange­
ments are complete.

President Sylvan Walter­
scheid conducted the business 
session and Father Christo­
pher met with the members.

visits through the building.
Those serving on commit­

tees are as follows: receiving 
line — Pres, and Mrs. James 
K. Kearns, Dean and Mrs. J. 
H. Parker, Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Brown, Mr. and Mrs. Harvey 
Woolfolk, Mr. and Mrs. War­
ren Flowers, Mr. and Mrs. 
Norris Scott, Mr. and Mrs. C. 
J. Paclik, Mr. and Mrs. Bern­
ard Bruns, Dr. and Mrs. Van 
Gene Kaden, Mr. and Mrs. 
Theo Embry, Mr. and Mrs. T. 
C. Schneider, Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Woodruff, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kermit Brown, Dr. and Mrs. 
Bob Kennedy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Merrick, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lacy Wheeler, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Dan Flint.

Mrs. Allene Hurley will 
have charge of decorations.

In charge of food service 
will be Mrs. Helen Seiwell, 
Mrs. Edith Peyton, Mrs. Ken­
neth Rivoire, Mrs. Jessie 
Rivoire, Miss Louise Harris, 
and Miss Ethel Hood of the 
Ex-Students. Mrs. Roy Davis

Election Dec. 31 
To Decide Fate of 
Clear Creek Dams

Taxpaying voters of the 
Clear Creek Watershed will 
go to the polls on December 
3! to decide on a proposed 
10 cent tax for the mainten­
ance of flood control struc­
tures and other operating ex­
penses.

The election was ordered 
last Saturday at a meeting of 
Clear Creek Watershed Au­
thority directors in the Muen­
ster State Bank.

As pointed out by President 
J. M. Weinzapfel this election 
is the key event which will 
decide whether projects spon­
sored by the Clear Creek Wa­
tershed Authority can be car­
ried to completion. According 
to present policy, Soil Con­
servation Service will not be­
gin construction on a flood 
control reservoir until the 
area concerned has provided 
a fund for its future main­
tenance. This means that some 
52 reservoirs now planned 
depend on the election of 
Dec. 31. If voters approve they 
will remove the last obstacle 
now holding back the pro­
gram, which is estimated at 
about $4.5 million.

Weinzapfel said that a 
similar election may soon be­
come necessary on the Elm 
Creek Watershed in order to 
complete its program. When 
SCS started building reser­
voirs on that watershed it 
made no requirement for a 
maintenance fund. A f t e r  
building 27 SCS now requires 
that a fund must be provided 
before the remaining 10 still 
on plans can be built.

The Clear Creek Watershed 
election will be held in six 
voting boxes: at Rosston, Era, 
Hardy, Dye Mound Bolivar 
and Blue MOund.

To vote a person must be 
a qualified voter for the year 
1959 and must also be a tax­
payer.

MHS Cagers Drop 
Two Games at Era

Muenster High’s basketball 
teams opened their season 
Tuesday night with a double 
loss at Era, the girls by a score 
of 39-35 and the boys 40-25.

In the curtain raiser Muen­
ster girls started slow and 
trailed 17-11 at the half then 
gained 3 in each of the next 
two periods for a 33-33 tie at 
the end of the regular time. 
Each team scored 2 in the 
first overtime. During the next 
overtime Era got a field goal 
and Muenster fouled in a 
frantic effort to catch up, and 
Era added 2 foul shots in the 
closing seconds. Fisher led 
MHS scorers with 20, Heilman 
made 8 and Dern 7. Era’s 
Smith took honors for the 
game with 27.

The boys’ game was close 
for three quarters, then Era 
got hot and ran away with it. 
In the first period Era led 
8-5 and at intermission it led 
17-16. In the third Muenster 
edged ahead briefly but Era 
regained the lead 24-22 at 
the end of the period. Then 
the one-sided final period in 
which the home team poured 
in 16 while Muenster got only 
3.

Scorers for Muenster were 
Harris 11, Joe Heilman 5, Mc- 
Elreath 4, Doug Heilman 3 
and Mark Heilman 2. Lewis 
and Wilson made 15 and 14 
for Era.

MHS will host Era Friday 
and play in the Callisburg 
tournament next week.

is chairman of food.
In charge of the coffee ser­

vice will be Miss Marie Can- 
nond, Mrs. Helen Horn, Mrs. 
Hugh Barnhart, Mrs. J. A. 
Gilliland, Mrs. John Gray, and 
Mrs. W. B. Ballew.

Students of the college in 
charge of registration will be 
Misses Patsy Turner, Nancy 
Knight, Pat Otto, Laura Mer­
cer, Jeanette Westbrook, Au- 
dra McMahon, Judi Miller and 
Jacquita Hughes, and Mrs. 
Nell Scott.

S. D. Woodmansee and the 
Music Department will be in 
charge of the program.

Acting as circulating hosts 
and hostesses will be Melinda 
Baugh, Sue Sirmans, Carl 
Cash, Wayne Haygood, Clyde 
Bond, Eddie Frank Morris, 
Max Alexander, Billy Otto, 
Richard Boley, Ernest Perkins, 
Graeie Schmitz, Mrs. Lura 
Brewer, Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Thompson, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Wade Mr. and Mrs. Otis Bart­
hold, Leroy Wiesman, Shirley 
Glenn, and Eva Lois Scott.

Bishop Gorman to 
Confirm Class of 
200 Sunday, 3 p.m.

His Excellency B i s h o p  
Thomas K. Gormon will be 
here Sunday afternoon to 
confirm a class of more than 
200. The service will begin at 
3 o’clock in Sacred Heart 
Church.

Others in the ceremonies 
will be members of the Fourth 
Degree Knights of Columbus 
as an honor guard for the 
bishop and an individual 
sponsor for each person to be 
confirmed.

NEWS
OF THE SICK

Frank Mages Sr., 88, under­
went surgery Tuesday morn­
ing at Gainesville Sanitarium 
after six days of illness and 
is reported “doing fine.” All 
of his children were at the 
hospital that day — from 
Muenster, Gainesville, Valley 
View, and Eddie Mages of 
Dallas, Lee Mages of Fort 
Worth, Carl Mages of Waco, 
Mrs. Lavel Kinstley of Corpus 
Christi and Mrs. Charlie Ber- 
end and Mrs. Ewald Berend 
of Hereford. Mr. Mages Sr., 
long-time resident of Lindsay, 
has been living here with his 
daughter, Mrs. Felix Yosten, 
for the past several months.

A broken right foot hasn’t 
made a shut-in out of Billy 
Frank Richter. He’s getting 
around as well as usual — on 
crutches.

Donald Hennigan has re­
covered from dental surgery 
performed in Denton last Fri­
day and has another appoint­
ment for more of the same 
on Dec. 7. It’s for four em­
bedded wisdom teeth.

Mrs. Ed Hacker was ad­
mitted to Gainesville Sanitar­
ium for medical care this 
week.

Joe Trachta is “all taped up” 
since Tuesday afternoon when 
a fall at his place of business 
broke a rib.

I n f a n t  William Huchton, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. A. J. 
Huchton, is still at Wilson- 
Jones Hospital in Sherman. 
He has spinal meningitis fol­
lowing pneumonia and is 
showing improvement after 
being critically ill. The doctors 
said the six-month-old baby 
will be hospitalized for a long 
time. Except for short periods 
when other family members 
are with him, his mother is 
at his bedside.

Paul Sicking was dismissed 
from Majors Clinic in Nocona 
Tuesday following surgery five 
days earlier. He entered the 
hospital on Monday last week 
for X-rays and observation, 
then came home for Thanks­
giving day and went back for 
the operation the next day.

Mrs. John Fette is recov­
ering satisfactorily and is up 
and around again following 
a recent sick spell.

Mrs. Alfred Hoedebeck of 
Denison is a patient at St. 
Paul’s Hospital in Dallas since 
she suffered a heart attack 
last Thursday and was under 
an oxygen tent until Sunday. 
Visiting her Sunday after­
noon were Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Hoedebeck, Mrs. Clem Reiter 
and Gene Hoedebeck. Paul 
Hoedebeck went with them 
and Basil Reiter accompanied 
them as far as Dallas Univers­
ity. Mrs. Alfred Hoedebeck is 
the former Irene Flusche and 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. A. 
C. Flusche of Denison, are 
taking care of the couple’s six 
children. Doctors said that 
after the hospital treatment 
Mrs. Hoedebeck will need 
complete rest for six months.

News of the 
Men in Service

Twin Brothers Inducted
Cecil and Cyril Hermes, 

twin sons of Mr. and Mrs. 
Tony Hermes of Lindsay and 
grandsons of Mrs. A 1 f o n s 
Koesler Sr. of Muenster, were 
inducted in the armed services 
this week and left Thursday 
to get into uniform. They 
were the only ones in the 
December call for Cooke 
County and made up the 
county’s draft quota.
Separated From Navy

Thomas Hesse came home 
for Thanksgiving, separated 
from the Navy after three 
and a half years of service. 
He had been stationed at 
Point Mugu, Calif;, and re­
ceived his separation papers 
there.

Election Set 
On Lindsay

Whether or not Lindsay will 
become an incorporated town 
depends on an election to be 
held there on December 31.

The election was set by the 
County Commissioners Court 
last Monday in response to a 
petition presented by a Lind­
say group. Twenty five per­
sons had signed the petition, 
five more than the minimum 
required by law to qualify for 
the election.

Persons eligible to vote are 
those whose poll tax receipt 
qualifies them to vote this 
year and who have been resi­
dents of the area to be in­
corporated for the past six 
months or longer. That area 
includes 640 acres with a

Local KCs Plan 
Special Event for 
50th Anniversary

Members of the Muenster 
K of C council are starting 
preparations for a special 
golden anniversary program 
commemorating the founding 
of their local chapter. The date 
has been set for Sunday, Jan­
uary 17, the nearest conven­
ient date to the charter an­
niversary, which falls on the 
16th.

Grand Knight Pat Henni­
gan has called a special meet­
ing for Monday night at 8 
o’clock to work on the plans. 
Asked to attend are the of­
ficers, the 6-point Program 
chairmen and the club com­
mittee.

The council’s charter lists 
45 men as original members. 
Nineteen of those, 13 in Muen­
ster and 6 out of town, are 
still living. The council hopes 
to have all of them present as 
special guests for the occasion.

Blessed Events

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Otto 
of Gainesville have announced 
the birth of Linda’s baby bro­
ther. He arrived at Sanitarium 
Tuesday, Dec. 1. 10:22 a.m. 
weighing seven pounds nine 
ounces. Mr. and Mrs. Joe Vo­
gel and Mr. and Mrs. W. W. 
Otto are the grandparents and 
Mrs. Emil Vogel is great­
grandmother again. The new 
baby and his sister have 
birthdays within the week. 
Linda will be three on Satur­
day, Dec. 5.

Happy over the birth of a 
son are Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Hoenig. The eight pound boy 
arrived at Gainesville Sani­
tarium Friday, Nov. 27, 7:33 
p.m. and is a brother for one- 
year-old Wilma. Welcoming 
another grandchild are Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Hoenig, and 
Mrs. Sophie Stoffels of Lind­
say.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Herr, 
511 S. Weaver St., Gainesville, 
are parents of a daughter born 
at the Sanitarium 9 a.m. Fri­
day, Nov. 27. She’s a seven 
pound one ounce sister for 
Donna and Timmy and a 
grandson for the Albert Hen- 
scheids and Frank Herrs. Mrs. 
Katie Roberg is the great­
grandmother. T h e  Ronnie 
Herrs moved the past week 
from Wichita Falls to reside 
in Gainesville.

A nine pound nine ounce 
son joined the Melvin Schu­
macher family of Gainesville 
on Thursday, Nov. 26, at the 
Sanitarium at 1:30 p.m. The 
Thanksgiving Day baby is a 
brother for Dale, Kenny and 
Karen and a grandson for the 
Henry Schumachers of Gaines­
ville and the Ted Gremmin- 
gerS.

It’s a boy was good news for 
Mr. and Mrs. William Hermes 
of Lindsay who welcomed the 
eight pound four and a half 
ounce lad on Wednesday, Nov. 
25, at Gainesville Sanitarium 
11:40 p.m. Also welcoming him 
are his sisters Debra, Alyce, 
Cheryl and Denise and the 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clem Hofbauer and Mr. and 
Mrs. Julius Hermes of Lind­
say. Counting another great­
grandchild are Mrs. Anna 
Loerwald of Lindsay and Mrs. 
Mike Kleiss. Mary Evelyn and 
William named their son Gary 
Wayne. He was christened in 
St. Peter’s Church Sunday 
afternoon with Father Alcuin 
officiating and Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Hermes as godpar­
ents for their nephew.

December 31 
Incorporation
population of 253 . . . the min­
imum legal requirement is 200 
. . . extending from a line 600 
feet north of Highway 82 to 
Elm creek south of town and 
also a mile west of a line ex­
tending south from Walter 
Nortman’s east property line. 
That takes in the property on 
both sides of the highway for 
a mile west of the Gainesville 
golf course and all the area 
for a mile south of that por­
tion of the highway.

If the election carries it will 
authorize Lindsay to proceed 
with the other legal details of 
incorporation. Besides applying 
for a charter from the State 
Secretary it will elect a town 
council and a marshal. The 
person receiving the most 
votes in the council election 
will become mayor and will 
be so commissioned by the 
county judge.

After incorporating as a 
town Lindsay can by action 
of its council and without an­
other election, incorporate as 
a city.

The purpose of the election 
is to authorize establishment 
of a governing body empow­
ered to function in behalf of 
the town’s interests. It will 
be able to improve streets and 
water and sewer facilities 
and to collect taxes for sup­
port of the public program. 
It will also become a legal 
entity immune from annexa­
tion by some other city or 
town.

It will also qualify to hold 
a local option election on 
legalizing the sale of alcoholic 
beverages as provided in a 
recent decision of the Texas 
Supreme Court.

SH Nips Lindsay 
In Double Header

The Tigers and Tigerettes 
of Sacred Heart High made 
a clean sweep of their series 
with Lindsay as they took 
both games of a double header 
on the local court Tuesday 
night. Other wins in a two 
game program with Lindsay 
had been chalked up some 10 
days before.

Both of Tuesday’s tussles 
were comparatively easy for 
the local teams. Sacred Heart 
girls led off with a win of 31- 
15 and the boys followed with 
a win of 38-25.

After a 4-4 tie in the first 
quarter Sacred Heart girls had 
two strong periods for leads 
of 13-8 at intermission and 
26-10 at the third quarter. In 
the final period they held 
their margin while coasting 
to a win of 31-15. Joyce 
Hacker was the big Tigerette 
scorer with 19 and Delores 
Hess led the visitors with 6.

Sacred Heart boys barely 
nudged ahead 6-5 in the open­
ing quarter and spurted to a 
20-8 lead at half time. In the 
third period the Knights 
gained a little for a score of 
29-20 but the Tigers took over 
again in the last and ended 
with a 38-25 lead. Len Haver- 
kamp and Wimmer hit 14 
each for the Tigers and R. 
Haverkamp made 11 for Lind­
say.

Next for Sacred Heart will 
be a series with Nocona, here 
Thursday night and there next 
Tuesday.

Lindsay will be in the Call­
isburg tournament next week, 
then will play Gainesville 
Junior High Dec. 14 and 17 
and Valley View Dec. 22.

Schedule of 
Coming Events

THURSDAY, Dec. 3, Organ­
ization meeting of civic group, 
Rohmer’s Restaurant, 7:30.

THURSDAY, Dec. 3, Sacred 
Heart vs. Nocona, here.

FRIDAY, Dec. 4, MHS vs. 
Era, here.

SUNDAY, Dec. 6, KC Initi­
ation at Gainesville.

MONDAY, Dec. 7, KC meet­
ing for officers, 6-point chair­
men and club committee.

MONDAY, Dec. 7, VFW 
Auxiliary meeting, VFW Hall, 
8 p.m.

MONDAY, Dec. 7, MHS vs. 
Forestburg at Callisburg tour­
ney.

TUESDAY, Dec. 8, Sacred 
Heart vs. Nocona, there.

TUESDAY, Dec. 8, Marian 
program in SHH Gym, 8:15 
p.m.

WEDNESDAY, Dec .  9, 
Knights of Columbus social 
in the KC Hall.

WEDNESDAY, every week, 
City Library open in City 
Hall, 9:30 to 5.

Open House to Show College Building
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YARDSTICK OF 
NATIONAL WELL-BEING

Theres a great deal of con­
troversy over Russia’s econ­
omic and scientific achieve­
ments. But one thing is sure 
— the Soviet leaders are mas­
ters of propaganda. The Rus­
sian people are deluged day 
and night with words designed 
to make them believe that 
communism does more for the 
masses than any other system. 
And Russian visitors to this

Sanders Jewelry
112 N. Commerce, G’ville

country, from Khrushchev 
down the line, take every 
conseivable opportunity to 
try to “sell” Russia’s progress 
and superiority.

Well, no one can blame them 
for that — it’s their job as 
dedicated communists. But 
when we get down to facts, 
the picture takes on a very 
different hue.

There’s only one way to 
judge the material well-being

*~foi

C ^ 6 6 6

WELDING

LATHE WORK

BOLTS, NUTS . . .  All sizes 

Muenster Machine Shop & Supply

to give with pride
..... &

Quickest way to solve present problems . . . 
choose irom our exciting array oi lovely things 
lor her to wear.

LINGERIE
Gorgeous gown and robe 

sets of nylon tricot in a big 
assortment of shades, styles 
and trims. $16.95 to $49.95.

Also wonderful selection of 
slips, half slips and pajamas.

COSTUME 
JEWELRY 

A big assortment 
cf the season's fa­
vorite designs.

$1.10 up

OTHER EXCITING GIFTS

Party dresses, blouses, sweaters, gloves, 
nylon hose . . .  or, in case you can't decide, 
a  Gift Certificate.

GIFT WRAPPING FREE

ZJhe Qadhion Shop
113 E. California, Gainesville

of a people — and that is by 
the yardstick of how much 
the average man’s income will 
buy in the market place. With 
one month’s wages, an Ameri­
can can buy suits and 24 
pairs of shoes. With one 
month’s wages, on the other 
hand, a Russian can buy half 
of a suit and a single pair of 
shoes. The situation is com­
parable in the case of most 
other consumer goods beyond 
the bare-necessity level.

In Russia, the government 
produces practically every­
thing and practically every­
thing is sold in government 
stores. Government decides 
all q u e s t i o n s  — what 
shall be produced and sold, 
of what quality, at what price. 
There is no competition.

In America, on the other 
h a n d, there’s competition 
every inch of the way from 
the source of raw materials to 
the finished goods offered at 
retail. The producer or re­
tailer who is able to offer the 
widest choice and best quality 
at least cost gets the trade. 
And that’s one of the main 
reasons by the American 
worker, with his month’s pay, 
can buy so many suits and 
shoes if he so desires — and 
the Soviet worker so few.

Mass merchandising meth­
ods, pioneered in the United 
States, give customers super 
services in foods and all man­
ner of personal and home 
necessities not enjoyed else­
where.

“Youth could well take for 
its creed today the Oath of 
Citizenship which the Youth 
of Athens took upon arriving 
at their majority.

“ ‘To bring no disgrace to 
this city by a dishonest act; 
to fight for the ideals and sac­
red things alone and with 
many; to desert no faltering 
comrade; to revere and obey 
the city laws; to incite respect 
and reverence in those above 
us who are prone to annul or 
set them at naught. To strive 
unceasingly to quicken the 
public sense of civic duty. To 
transmit this city no less but 
more beautiful that it was 
transmitted to us.’

“If the Youth of today would 
do this, there would be no 
need to fear the future.”
— Birmingham Labor News

IT HAPPENED 
20 YEARS AGO

December 1. 1939
Gala f e s t i v a l  observes 

Muenster’s 50th anniversary; 
attendance is estimated at 
5000; former residents and rel­
atives join local residents in 
attendance at pageant, solemn 
church service, dinner and 
picnic in that order. The Joe 
Voths announce the birth of 
a son. Slow 36 hour rain 
brings relief to small grain 
crops. About 100 persons from 
here attend new church dedi­
cation at Decatur.* Lindsay 
choir members have annual 
banquet. S. W. CaiA of Myra 
opens helpy-selfy laundry in 
Stelzer building. John Thei- 
sen, 85, of Lindsay sustains 
broken hip in fall. Hyacinth 
Study Club with Olivia Stock 
as leader has regular meeting 
with eight members present.

15 YEARS AGO
December 1, 1944

Thermometers register sea­
son’s low of 30 degrees Mon­
day . . . Friday’s two-inch 
rain brings November mois­
ture to four and a half inches. 
Kay joins the Herman Fette 
family. Mr. and Mrs. E. P. 
Buckley observe 25th wedding 
anniversary with dinner party. 
Sailor Lawrence Roberg is at

Make your home brighter for Christmas

Re-Decorate a Room
We highly recommend our line of 
paints and wallpapers for the job

Com m unity Lum ber Co.
Phone 49, Muenster, Texas

home on leave for first visit 
in 13 months. Otto Walter- 
scheid and Steve Moster write 
from the Philippines. Alois 
Rohmer is advanced to staff 
sergeant in Holland. T. J. 
Hoffman receives leg injury 
in simulated bombing mission 
on the west coast.

10 YEARS AGO
December 2, 1949

Early start on new building 
is goal of church committee. 
FM Road project south of 
'Muenster begins this week. 
Community Council will hear 
John Surratt as guest speaker. 
Thieves steal car belonging to 
James Sims in day light rob­
bery. Infant sen of A1 Eber- 
harts dies shortly after birth. 
Olive Haverkamp wins queen’s 
crown in Thanksgiving festi­
val contest. Count of parish 
membership reveals total of 
1778. Richard Wimmer sur­
vives broken neck in oil field 
accident. Father John Walbc 
goes to Boonville, Mo., hos­
pital with yellow jaundice 
and Rev. Andrew Wewers of 
Corpus Christi is here as 
supply pastor. Lucille Cler 
weds Charles McClaflin in 
Fort Worth. Mrs. Tony Tru- 
benbach wins grand prize in 
CDA sponsored cake baking 
contest. Texaco Station is new 
bus depot.

WOODRUFF
PHARMACY

Next to Post Office 
Gainesville

5 YEARS AG O
December 3, 1954

Hamric’s new store for men 
and boys opens this week. 
Opening of Scott Bros. Furn­
iture set for next week. Mrs. 
J. G. Biffle Sr. of Myra re­
ceives severe body burns in 
gas line leak fire at her home. 
Thieves get 20 hogs in raid 
on Frank Stoffels’ pig pen. 
Mrs. Sally Kidd and Hollis 
Kidd family lose home and 
furnishings in fire. Nineteen 
lettermen named on Hornet 
team. Twenty Tiger gridders 
will receive awards at annual 
banquet. Donald Muller wins 
corporal stripes in Germany. 
Betty Luttmer and Freddie 
Neu marry at Gainesville. 
Harold Reeves and Dorothy 
Gilliland marry in home cere­
mony. Bulcher HD Club sends 
gifts to hospital to - cheer 
patients. Mr. and Mrs. Russell 
Herb and family move to Dal­
las. Mr. and Mrs. Ben Her­
mes celebrate silver wedding 
anniversary. N ew  arrivals: 
boys for the Ben Fleitmans 
and Wally Luttmers.

"Beauty Is Not a Gift 
, . . It's a  Habit."

FASHIONETTE 
BEAUTY SALON 

Dorothy Mitchell and 
Wanda Hess, operators 

303 S. Chestnut, HO5-9402 
Gainesville

UR' tfnJtfx
'm'M . /AGtl

YOURy
insurant t

BEFORE BUYING 
INSURANCE

Ij'ptnJrnt . . .  it is important to know if 
AGENT your agent will be available to 

assist you on claim settlements. 
WE WILL!

For professional insurance service see

I. M. Weinzapfel Insurance Agency
Herbert Meurer J. M. Weinzapfel Earl Fisher 

Representing only old line stock companies

Flowers (or 
Every Occasion

Since 1884 It's

KADEN, The Florist
Flowerphone H05-5221, Gainesville

Represented in Muenster by Mrs. Nick Miller

A  G R A N D  HOLIDAY SELECTION!

FOR ENTERTAINING 
FOR GIFTING

You name it, we most likely have it! You'll 
find us stocked with a  really good selection 
of popular brands of whiskey, brandy, gin, 
vodka, liqueur, wine, champagne, cognac and 
beer.

Beautifully
Packaged

for
Christmas

Giving

8 2  Liquors
Carl Walterscheid, owner

Check our Shelves — Count the Savings

M o r e  U est I3ugs
4 + To m Th umb

Dollar
Specials

Ocean Spray, No. 300 can

Cranberry Sauce _•
Ocean Spray, 12 oz. can

Cranberry Sauce -
Welch's 20 oz. jar

Grape Jelly _ .  .
Del Monte, No. 303 can

Golden Com, C.S. _
Kleenex 400 count

Facial Tissue .  _

5 for $1.00

6 for $1.00

3 for $1.00

. 6 for $1.00

4 for $1.00

Alma No. 300 can

Butter Beans G & W Limas 
Green Peas Spaghetti

Mix or Match _ _ 12 for $1.00

Tom Thumb
G A I N E S V I L L E

Tom's Meats
Mohawk thick sliced

Bacon .  _ . .2  lbs. 69c
Armour's Matchless Traypack

Bacon . .  _ _ lb. 35c
Armour's Star Pure Pork

Sausage .  _ .  2 lbs. 69c
Heavy Choice Beef

Seven Roast _ _ lb. 49c
Heavy Choice Beef

Ami Roast .  .  _lb. 55c

Produce
Kentucky Wonder

Beans _ _ _ _ lb. 19c
Cello Bag

New Potatoes _ 2 lbs. 19c
Texas Juice

Oranges .  5 lbs. 39c
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PERMANENT W AVE  
SPECIALS

Tues., Wed., Thurs.
LUCILLE ALLEN 

Clyde Mabry, cosmetics
Closed Monday

Allen's Beauty Shop
106 E. Elm, H05-4181 

Gainesville
W e Give Scottie Stamps

Mr. and Mrs. Albert A.. 
Knabe and family were in 
Pilot Point on Thanksgiving 
day to have dinner with her 
father, August Sprengel and 
the Ben Knabes. The Gene 
Tysons and children of Pilot 
Point were also present.

s r
K

C. J. Kaiser and Tony Koesler 
announce the opening of

Cut Rate 
Liquors

With a big assortment of the 
leading brands of 

Liquors, Wines and Beers

Big choice 
of attractive 

Holiday 
Packages

Granddaughter of 
Jake Pagels Wins 
Honors in Germany

The Jake Pagels’ grand­
daughter, Cheryl Janicki, 11- 
year-old of CWO and Mrs. 
John P. Janicki, won two hon­
ors recently in Wurzburg, 
Germany, where the family 
lives.

Cheryl’s awards came for 
making the winning poster in 
a contest observing National 
Fire Week, and for her entry 
in a contest naming the Wurz­
burg Girl Scout newspaper. 
Her title “Our News Parade” 
was selected from 150 names 
submitted.

In both instances Cheryl re­
ceived mementos in recogn; - 
tion of her accomplishments. 
In the final ceremony ending 
National Fire Week the post 
commander, Gen. Fox, made 
the presentation and in the 
paper naming contest Mrs. 
Upham, wife of Major General 
John S. Upham, Third Divi­
sion Commander, presented

H.0. Kinne,0.D.
OPTOMETRIST 

210 E. Calif., Gainesville
State License No. 26

Guaranteed
W aves

$15.00, $12.50, $10.00
Half price when 

two come together

Audra's 
Beauty Shop

307 E. Pecan, HO5-4025 
Gainesville

Fife

under the 
jacket —  the dress you adore

So becoming with its squared-off 
neckline, shirred midriff, gay whirl 

of a skirt! More good news: 
the platter collar on the sheltering 

bolero. In Cohama’s Arnel Cotillion. 
Holly red, purple, stadium blue. 

Sixes 5 to 15.-

priceless young fashions

$17.98

the prize at a ceremony in 
the quarters of General Up­
ham.

News of the contest results 
were published in The Marne 
Rock, a newspaper done by 
and for the Third Infantry 
Division in Germany. Cheryl’s 
daddy is serving in Wurzburg 
with the Seventh Army Quar­
termaster office.

Mrs. Janicki wrote that the 
three girls in school, Cheryl, 
Donna a n d  Janelle enjoy 
classes, belong to the pep 
squad and are beginning to 
speak German fluently. The 
other girls, Starla and Renee 
are pre-school age. This will 
be the family’s third Christ­
mas in Wurzburg arci thoughts 
of the he’ .day season brought 
thoughts of their friends in 
Muenster and they sent best 
wishes for Christmas and New 
Year to all they know here.

Mrs, H. Falck Has 
Lunch With Mamie

Mrs. Hal Falck, writing 
from Augusta, Ga., tells her 
parents, the Jake Pagels, of 
an exciting time attending a 
luncheon at Fort Gordon’s 
officers’ club honoring Mrs 
Dwight D. Eisenhower.

Mamie charmed everyone 
with her warm friendliness and 
her short talk. She was wear­
ing a navy blue costume suit 
and pillbox hat. Meanwhile 
the President was in the area 
for a round of golf.

Officers wives planned and 
put on the two and a half 
hour luncheon for the First 
Lady. Major Falck is Acting 
Adjutant General, Headquar­
ters, Provost Marshal, General 
Center at Fort Gordon and as 
his wife Mrs. Falck was in 
close company with Mrs 
Eisenhower during the after­
noon. The guests were all 
women.

Birthday Brings 
Family Gathering 
For Jim Walker

J i m Walker’s birthday 
brought h i s children and 
grandchildren to help him 
celebrate and they brought 
birthday gifts, a decorated 
cake and a turkey dinner for 
the celebration. Mr. Walker 
was a young 72.

Spending the day with the 
honoree and his mother, Mrs. 
Ada Walker, were Mr. and 
Mrs. A. W. Carlev and family 
of Hurst and Mr. and Mrs. 
Leonard Luttmer and three 
daughters of Valley View.

Granny Walker enjoyed the 
Sunday party from her bed. 
A shut-in for many years, she 
is now almost constantly a 
bed patient. Jim Walker takes 
care of his mother. He is ac­
tive (in the Shiloh Baptist 
Church and has been a dea­
con in the church for over 30 
years. Born in Tennessee on 
Nov. 29, 1887, he has lived 
north of Muenster since he 
was three years old.

Sprengel Clan Has 
All-Day Reunion

Members of the August J. 
Sprengel family gathered Sun­
day at the Sprengel home in 
Pilot Point for an all-day re­
union while Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred J. Sprengel and children 
Sandra and Mike of Canon 
City, Colo., were there. Pic­
ture taking added to the day’s 
fun. Thirty-six family mem­
bers were present.

Joining Mr. Sprengel and 
his Colorado guests for the 
day were Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
A. Knabe and children of 
Muenster, the Frank and 
Henry Sprengel families of 
Fort Worth, the Kasimer 
Sprengels and children of 
Denton, the Gene Tysons and 
family and the Ben Knabes 
of Pilot Point. Only one miss­
ing was August Sprengel Jr. 
who lives in California.

C IT A T IO N  B Y  P U B L IC A T IO N
THE STATE OF TEXAS

TO: Berry R. Truitt and the heirs 
and representatives of Berry R. 
Truitt and the unknown heirs and 
representatives of Berry R. Truitt. 
Defendant. Greeting:

YOU ARE HEREBY COMMAND­
ED to appear before the Honorable 
16th District Court of Cooke Coun­
ty at tlie Courthouse thereof in 
Gainesville, Texas, by filing a 
written answer at or before 10 
o ’clock A M. of the first Monday 
next after the expiration of forty- 
two days from the date of the is­
suance of this citation, same be­
ing the 14th day of December A.D. 
1959. to Plaintiff's Petition filed in 
said court, on the 30th day of 
October A.D. 1959, in this cause, 
numbered 18642 on the docket of 
said court and styled J. W. Truitt, 
Plaintiff, vs. Berry R. Truitt et 
al, Defendant.
„ ,A brlef statement of the nature of this suit is as follows, to wit: 
trespass to tfy title to 34 acres of 
land in Cooke County, Texas, be- 
lng J '* acres of ’ and out of the Ĵ  Trussell Survey. Abstract No. 
1224, and 24% acres of land out of 
the J. R. Bean Survey, Abstract 
™°'j ®2v..as ,s more fully shown by Plaintiffs Petition on file in this suit.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the date 
Of its issuance, it shall be returned 
unserved.

The officer executing this writ 
shall promptly serve the same ac­
cording to requirements of 

the mandates hereof, 
as the

law,
and
law

and __ ___________
make due return
directs.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the seal of said court at 
Gainesville, Texas, this the 30 
day of October A.D. 1959.

(SEAL) Attest: Milton Thomason 
clerk. District Court Cooke County, 
Texas. By Anna Mae Shorter, 
Deputy.

51-52-1-2

Pat Horn Pledges 
Theta Sigma Phi

Pat Horn, University of 
Texas junior majoring in 
journalism, is a new member 
of Theta Sigma Phi, profes­
sional sorority for women in 
journalism.

She will take part in the 
pledge service Sunday, Dec. 
6.

Candidates for Theta Sigma 
Phi must have a B average 
or better in journalism and 
at least a C average in all 
other subjects. They must also 
be engaged in some campus 
journalism activity.

Pat spent the recent holi­
days here with her family, 
the Joe Horns Another guest 
of the family was Paul Deltz 
of Alta Loraa, also a student 
at Texas University. They 
made the trip with Dorv 
Linker a senior student of 
the University who spent the 
holidays with his family at 
Gainesville.

Mary Pick of Fort Worth 
spent the holiday and week­
end with her family, the 
Henry Picks.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Fisher 
had their two daughters from 
Fort Worth at home for 
Thanksgiving. Clara had the 
one day off and Emma re­
mained through the weekend.

You Can’t 
Look Your Best

Unless 
Your Clothes 

Look Their Best

LONE STAR 
CLEANERS

HATTERS
I. P. GOSLIN, Prop. 
H05-2151, Gainesville

EAT OUT! Give Mom a Break!

Give Mother some occasion­
al kitchen relief. Bring the 
family to us for choice char­
coal steaks, sea foods, Mexi­
can foods, dinners and plate 
lunches . . .  in the pleasant 
surroundings of our big 
new dining room.

WE HAVE YOUR FAVORITE BRAND OF BEER

ROHMER'S RESTAURANT
On Highway 82, Muenster

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTING

Fixtures
Supplies

Appliances
Residential, Commercial 

and Oil Field Wiring 
Installations, Repairs 

Appliance Repairs

Call H05-2721
Nights call

H05-3263 or HO5-2204

Parker Electric
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville

e'«

fglitter glamour!
6

i

Fabled flattery — hostess slippers 
to grace a thousand and one nights. 

Piich toned velvets, studded with 
stones, sparkled with gold or 

spangled with silver.

FREE GIFT WRAPPING

Hartman's Shoe Store
SHOES FOR THE ENTIRE FAMILY

SIFTS for M il
To H ear H im  C heer, Choose H e re !
Gifts from here win cheers from men at Christmas . . .  

because it’s our business to know what men like I

Curlee

Haggar

Stetson

Champ

Van Heusen

Winas

McGreaor

Town 'n Trail

Esquire

Paris

Swank

Robert Bruce

Brentwood

Suits
Sport coats
Top coats
Slacks
Hats
Gloves
Robes
Pajamas
Ties
Sport shirts
Dress shirts
Jackets
Sweaters
Scarfs
Belts
Jewelry
Jewelry boxes
Socks
Slipper socks

If in doubt give a 
Gift Certificate

HAMRIC'S
The place to go for brands you know

FREE

GIFT

WRAPPING



Extra pleasure 
with your meal

S f j g f * '*

Take time to enjoy flavorful, delicious 

Pearl Beer—  always more re fre s h in g  

and satisfying, and at a popular price.
Vt i'«>*•'

Announcing 
the opening of

City
Liquor Store
With a large stock of popular 

brands of liquor, wine and beer

LOXLEY COCHRAN
Next door to Post Office

S A V I N G S !
SERVICE!MORE

Giant Tide _ _ _ _ _ _  69c

Chili, Wolf’s No. 2 _______ 59c

. _ 2 for 25c
Tender Sweet, No. 300

Green Beans _ _
Folger's 6 oz.

Instant Coffee _ 

Gladiola Biscuits .
Del Monte 46 oz.

Tomato Juice _ _
Morton's qt.

Salad Dressing .
Keith's 10 oz.

Frozen Spinach _
Keith's 10 oz.

Frozen Cut Corn _

_____ 79c

_ 3 for 25c

.  2 for 59c

_____ 39c

_ 2 for 29c 

_____19c

GET YOUR

Fruit Cake Mix in Bulk
AND SAVE THE DIFFERENCE 

SEE US ABOUT

Good Home-Killed Beef
WHOLE OR HALF CARCASS

Fisher's Market & Grocery
Muenster

Mary Trubenbach 
And Bill Blythe 
Say Vows at Mass

Sacred Heart Church was 
the scene of nuptial high mass 
and a double ring ceremony 
when Mary Louise Truben­
bach became the bride of Bill 
B. Blythe Saturday afternoon. 
Rev. Christopher Paladino of­
ficiated at the 4:30 service.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Alois Truben­
bach and Mrs. Emmett Blythe 
and the late Mr. Blythe of 
Boonville, Ark.

Mr. Trubenbach escorted his 
daughter to the altar and 
gave her in marriage. She 
wore a gown of pearl white 
chiffon taffeta designed with 
a moulded bodice, square 
neckline, short sleeves com­
plemented by opera-length 
white gloves and a volumin­
ous skirt that swept into an 
aisle-wide court train. Medal­
lions of Venise lace were ap- 
pliqued on the gown’s bodice 
and skirt. A crown of imported 
pearlized orange blossoms held 
her circular veil of illusion 
and she carried a purple- 
throated white orchid sur­
rounded by stephanotis.

Maid of honor was the 
bride’s sister, Kathy Truben­
bach, and bridesmaid was 
Gwen Friske of Gainesville. 
They wore identical dresses 
or deep rose velvet with bouf­
fant short skirts of unpressed 
pleats and matching half-hats 
with brief circular veils. They 
carried muffs of tiny pink 
rosebuds.

A. J. Blythe of Boonville 
was his brother’s best man 
and Lloyd Trubenbach was 
groomsman in his sister’s 
wedding. Jimmy Fisher and 
Francis Fisher, bride’s cous­
ins, were ushers.
. After mass Mrs. Norbert 

Walterscheid was soloist while 
the newly married pair went 
to the Blessed Virgin’s altar 
and lighted a taper. Anthony 
Luke was organist and the 
church choir sang the mass.

House party members at the 
reception and dinner in the 
Muenster High School dining 
room included Mrs. Joe Leh- 
nertz, caterer, Judy Truben­
bach, sister of the bride, and 
Mrs. Don Whitt, who regis­
tered the guests and Sally 
Falls and Ginger Wolf who 
poured punch.

Mr. and Mrs. Blythe will 
live in Fort Worth after a 
short trip. The bride traveled 
in a blue wool suit with brown 
mink collar and alligator ac­
cessories. She was graduated 
from Muenster High and St, 
Joseph’s School of Nursing 
in Fort Worth. The groom 
was graduated from Arkansas
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Francis Wiese
at Kinne's Jewelry 

Gainesville

NOTE TO SANTA
from

The Charm Shop
Choose from our fashion­
able collection of gifts that 

will delight your lady's 
heart.

Jeweled sweaters 
Gloves, Bags 

Suits, Coats 
Robes, Hose 
Dressy dresses 
Party dresses 

Tailored dresses 
Baby doll pajamas 

Costume jewelry 
Tailored pajamas 

Brunch and house coats 
Sweater and skirt sets 

Fancy and tailored match­
ing slips, half slips, pan- 
ties and bras.
If you can't decide or 
don't know her size, give 
a  Gift Certificate.

It always pleases.

*7/tm GUalm SUap,
Muenster

Cooke County 
Distributing Company

Urban Endres, Distributor 
Ph. 33 or 44 Muenster

Roy Redman of Denton spent 
the recent holidays with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. B. C. 
Redman at Saint Jo and went 
from there to attend the Texas 
Methodist Student Movement 
State Convention at South­
western University. Roy is 
president of the Methodist 
Student Movement at North 
Texas State College and is 
representing that group at the 
conference.

William Fisher of Subiaco 
Academy spent the Thanks­
giving holidays here with his 
family, the Paul Fishers.

Big choice of men's and 
ladies' fine watches by 
Bulova, Hamilton, Croton 
and Gruen.

$24.75 up

Polytechnic College in Rus 
sellville, Ark., and attended 
the University of Arkansas in 
Fayetteville where he received 
his degree in electrical en­
gineering.

Out of town wedding guests 
included Mrs. Emmett Blythe, 
Mrs. Betty Hyde, Joyce and 
Diane Kirkendall, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. J. Blythe and son 
Randall, all of Boonville, Sally 
Falls, Phyllis Vader, Ginger 
Wolf, Marlene Bezner and 
Jim Bass, all of Fort Worth.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Billing­
sley of Odessa, Mr. and Mrs. 
F. J. Higgins of Monahans, 
Francis Fisher and Jim Fisher 
of Lubbock, Ina Daws of 
Plainview, S.Sgt. and Mrs. 
Joe Galloway of Wichita Fails, 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Whitt of 
Columbus, Ga., Gene Walter 
of Birmingham, Ala., and Ben 
Otto and Messrs, and Mmes. 
Arnold Friske, Henry Voth 
and Henry Voth Jr. of Gaines­
ville.

Local News
B R I E F S

Mrs. Harold Walterscheid, 
Delbert and Shirley, and Wil- 
mer Walterscheid drove to 
Oklahoma City Wednesday to 
spend the day with Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Harris and girls.

Douglas Edward Cler was 
christened Tuesday in Sacred 
Heart Church, Father Chris­
topher officiating, with Phillis 
and Gary Cler as godparents 
for their brother.

Mr. and Mrs. J. M. Wein- 
zapfel represented Muenster 
and the Upper Elm-Red Soil 
Conservation District at the 
Tenth Annual Bridwell Soil 
Builders Awards Banquet in 
Wichita Falls on November 
19.

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Cap- 
linger and sons Paul, Bobby 
and Jerry of Sherman were 
here Thanksgiving for a visit 
with her mother, Mrs. Alphons 
Koesler Sr. and other rela­
tives and enjoyed the parish 
picnic in the afternoon.

Joe Hermes Home 
Scene of Reunion

The Pete Koelzer family 
couldn’t b e  together on  
Thanksgiving so they had 
their reunion and dinner here 
Sunday in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Hermes and 
daughters Sharon, Kathleen 
and Della Rose.

Mrs. Hermes’ parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pete Koelzer and 
children Dolores, Norman and 
Melvin came from Madill, 
Okla., to spend the day and 
others present were Mr. and 
Mrs. Arnold Knabe and child­
ren Janet, Carol and Gary and 
Mr. and Mrs. Victor Koelzer 
and Kenny,

Fisher Family at 
Umbarger Reunion

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Fisher 
and children s p e n t  the 
Thanksgiving holidays visiting 
members of her family in 
Umbarger and Amarillo and 
saw most of the kinfolks at 
a reunion in the home of her 
brother, A. C. Evers, at Um­
barger.

In Umbarger they were 
houseguests of Mrs. Fisher’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. E. J. 
Evers. It was baby Judy Ann 
Fisher’s first visit with her 
grandparents. In Amarillo the 
Fishers visited h e r  sister 
and family, the Melvin Feno- 
glios. Four inches of snow 
covered the ground and ther­
mometers stood at 4 degrees 
preventing further visits with 
friends in that area. It was 
the first trip the Fishers made 
in their new Ford Station- 
wagon.

In All 
The World
No one is more 

understanding or 
more qualified 
to serve you.

Gary Yosten of Hereford 
visited with his grandparents, 
the Nick Yostens, a few days 
this week while his maternal 
grandmother, Mrs. Ewald Ber- 
end and his aunt, Mrs. Charlie 
Berend of Hereford, visited at 
the bedside of their father, 
Frank Mages Sr., at Gaines­

ville Sanitarium. The three ar­
rived Monday and returned 
home Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hoehn 
and children Kathy and Don 
of Fort Worth visited here 
Sunday with his sister and 
family, the Ed Clers.

GEO. J .

Carroll NEWLAND FURNITURE CO.
Gainesville

&. SON

Mr. and Mrs. Ervin Hamric 
enjoyed Saturday overnight 
and Sunday visiting in Okla­
homa City with his aunt and 
Mrs. Hamric’s sister and fam­
ily, the A. A. Hellams. Bert 
Hamric of the University of 
Oklahoma at Norman joined 
his parents for the visit with 
relatives.

YOU pick the floor now. An unusual gift 
that will be unusually welcome. We'll help 
you make the right selection for your 
needs . . . and for your budget.
SHE picks the color. After Christmas your 
wife can drop in and make her choice 
from our wide range of styles and colors 
. . .  to match your decor.

Special prices on all carpeting in stock.

A  bright new carpet or linoleum floor for 
Christinas . . .  a  wonderful idea for any 
room in the house.
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NOTICE.
Our cleaning and pressing 

and shoe repair department 
will be closed on December 
8. Nick and Adelina. 2-1

FOR SALE: Modern 3- bed­
room, or 2-bedroom and den, 
home in Saint Jo. Four year’s 
old. Centra) heat, double gar­
age, quarter of a block. $2,000 
for equity and take up $69 
payments on 4 M FHA loan. 
Must sell now at 60% of re­
placement cost. Earnest E. 
Hayley, Phone 2296, Saint Jo.

2-1

FOR YOUR FARM NEEDS

Gasoline, Oil, Supplies, etc.
Call Gulf Oil Corporation

Jimmy Lehnertz, Dist. 
H05-4562 — HO5-5420

Gainesville
Or see your local dealer 
Ferd Luttmer, Muenster

NEW
McCulloch

O N E / 4 0
CHAIN SAW

FOR COWS that look better, 
milk more and sell higher, 
breed your cows to American 
Breeders Service. Every sire 
proved g f  eat .  H05-2828, 
Gainesville. 37tf

FOR A LASTING Christmas 
gift give World Book Encyclo­
pedia. New 1960 edition avail­
able at 1959 prices until Jan. 
1. Weldon Holland. l-3p

NOTICE
For pickup and delivery 

service for that good 
SANITONE Dry Cleaning 

and Laundry Service 
Coll 207 in Muenster 

Eddie’s Texaco Station 
Agent, Robran’s Cleaners tf

FOR LEASE: 245 acres of 
grass land north or Muenster. 
Lucille K. Bell, Gainesville.

2-1
FARM HOUSE FOR RENT 
Good condition, 2 bedrooms, 

modern. See M. B. Bayer. 2-2
Chain Link Fence Installed
Let us figure your fencing 

needs.
C.D. Shamburger Lumber Co.

ltf

SHOE REPAIRING. Full 
line Cavalier polish. Nick and 
Adelina Miller, Muenster. 2-tf

WELCOME to a rummage 
sale Friday and Saturday, Dec. 
4 and 5, at the skating rink 
in Saint Jo. Suits $2.00 up, 
Shoes 15c up, Ladies dresses 
25c up. Many bargains Open 
all day. 2-lp

TABLE LEGS 
All sizes, 6 in. to 28 in. 

Metal or Wood
Community Lumber Co. 16t.f

= > 1 5 4 “
• Torture-tested for 

dependability
• Lubri-Mac Automatic O iler'
• Takes bars up to 24"
• Cuts stumps within 

iy 2" of ground
«  Pintail Chain

High Trade-Ins
Use McCulloch 

Pintail Chain
George Gehrig Hardware

Muenster, Texas

FOR LEASE: 400 acres of 
pasture 2 miles east of Marys­
ville. Contact Richard Stark, 
ph. H05-9311, Gainesville. 3-1

w
SELECTED / / S I  RES

T h e  Eosy 3 -P o in t  
W a y  to  H ig h e r  

D a ir y  P ro fits

1. Y O U  FEED 'EM

2. Y O U  M IL K  'EM

3. C A L L  Y O U R  C O B A  
T E C H N IC IA N  T O  
BREED 'EM

JERRY HOENIG
Technician

Call 241-R-4 or 87 
before 10 a.m.

GLASS
Plate, window, automobile, 

f irniture tops, mirrors. Old 
mirrors resilvered. For com­
plete glass service call Gaines­
ville Glass Shop. H05-3321, 
311 N. Chestnut.

FOR RENT: 3 room fur­
nished house in Muenster. Call 
or see Irene Frost, 112 Blan­
ton, phone H05-3126 after 3 
p.m., Gainesville. 49-tf

CLEANING and pressing. 
We pick up and deliver. Phone 
26, Nick and Adelina Miller, 
Muenster. 2-tf

SAVE MONEY. Let Pearson 
Huneycutt do your watch and 
clock repair work. 406 N. 
Grand Gainesville. 49tf

HAND SAWS FILED 
AND RE-TOOTHED 

Guaranteed precision work 
with Foley automatic ma­
chines. See Matt Schmitz, 
Muenster 33-26p

ELECTRIC MOTORS 
In sizes ranging from Y4 HP 

to 2 HF. Motor pulleys, pop­
ular sizes in stock, others 
available in a hurry.
Community Lumber Co. 16tf

VENETIAN BLINDS
Repaired, Retaping and re­

cording. Tony Homig, Phone 
53-W-l, Muenster 50tf

CARBORUNDUM grinding 
wheels, all sizes, and sickle 
grinders. Community Lumber 
Co. 25tf

WATCH & JEWELRY 
REPAIR

All cleaning done by elec- 
trosonic machine and timing 
checked by Watchmaster. 

BROWNING’S JEWELRY
Gainesville 11-tf

SHOE REPAIRING 
We do fine repair and dye 

work on all types of shoes, 
also saddle work. J a c k  
Cheaney’s Saddle & Shoe 
Shop, Across from bus station, 
Gainesville. 17tf

Dirt Work of All Kinds
See us for tanks, terraces 

and any kind of dirt work. We 
have the right equipment to 
give you a good job and a 
good deal on any kind of 
earth moving.

GILBERT ENDRES 45tf

NEW AND USED 
CARS AND PICKUPS 

Good selection of makes and 
models. Try us before you buy. 

KUBIS AND SONS 
1105-9711, Gainesville 49-tf

NECCHI-ELNA 
SEWING MACHINES 

Sales . . Service . . Rentals 
Also service on other makes 

of sewing machines. New 
Necchi machines for rent. 
Custom made buttons, button 
holes, buckles, belts. 

Necchi-Elna Sewing Circle 
H05-2542, 320 E. Calif. 

Gainesville
TANKS FOR SALE. Septic 

tanks, stock tanks, grain tanks, 
water tanks. Will install. Bay­
er Bros., Ph. 225-J-2, Muen­
ster. 6tf

SINGER
Sewing Machine Co.

SALES AND SERVICE 
Mail a card to 311 E. Calif­

ornia, Gainesville, or phone 
HO5-5032. Or leave word at 
Ferd’s Gulf Station, Muenster

DRESSED YOUNG HENS 
Bagged and ready for your 

freezer. 30 cents per lb. in 
lots of 6 or more.

Muenster Hatchery 39tf

47 Years of Dependable Electric Service
AN EXAMPLE OF AMERICAN FREE ENTERPRISE

I  exas Power & Light Company, operating under our country * 
free enterprise system, has by sound management and careful 
planning kept ahead of the electrical service requirements of its 
service area.

During the past five years alone, the Company has spent more 
than $112 million dollars for construction of new power plants and 
other facilities to serve you. Today, the Company is busy building 
for future growth in the area it serves One example of this is the 
Valley Generating Station being constructed in North Texas.

* TP&L is a business-managed, investor owned, electric utility 
company . . .  a typical example of American free enterprise. Its 
expansion is carried on with private funds and requires none o f  
your tax dollars. In contrast, government sponsored power projects 
consume rather than pay taxes.

Texas Power & Light Company takes pride in its nearly one-half 
century of service to the North. East and Central Texas area and 
pledges to continue supplying dependable, low-cost, electric service 
through efficient, business-managed operation

’ T E X A S  P O W E R  A L I G H T  C O M P A N Y

NEW ARRIVALS IN 
OUR GIFT DEPARTMENT 
Lovely selection of china, 

glassware, pictures, plaques, 
statues, figurines, exquisite 
ceramics and metal items. 
Come early while selections 
are better and use our lay­
away plan.

Albert Plumbing & Heating 
209 E. Calif., Gainesville 49-tf

S P E C I A L  
U s e d  Maytag automatic 

washers, completely over­
hauled, 3 months guarantee. 
$99.50 and old washer.
Albert Plumbing & Heating 
209 E. Calif., Gainesville 17tf

Monuments 
and Grave Markers

See Tony Otto 17tf
LIGHT FIXTURES for any 

room of the house in stock at 
Community Lumber Co. 40tf

PIPE, Big, medium sized or 
small, new and used. Also 
sucker rods.

J. P. FLUSCHE 9-tf
BICYCLE PARTS 

AND REPAIRS 
Hennigan Motor Co. 15tf 

MOTORS, all sizes, for milk 
ing machines, water pumps, 
oil field equipment, etc. C. D. 
Shamburger Lumber Co. 43tf

Don’t let JUNK IRON clut­
ter up your place. Bring it in 
and sell it to J. P. FLUSCHE.

9tf
It Pays to Check Our Prices
. . . on car, truck or tractor 
tires and batteries and acces- 
sories.

FERD’S GULF STATION

CONCRETE WORK 
We’ll do any kind of a 

concrete job or furnish ready 
mix concrete for your job.

Bayer Brothers 28tf
DEARBORN HEATERS
All sizes, for natural gas 

or butane.
Enderby Butane Gas

Gainesville 48tf
WINDOW SHADES, with or 

without rollers, plastic or 
Clopay. Washable, cut to your 
size.

VARIETY STORE 31tf
TRAILER FOR SALE. 32 

ft. long, single axle, cattle 
boards, air brakes. Good con­
dition. Bayer Bros. 42tf

DAIRYMAN
Select and use the individu­

al bull that will correct your 
herd weakness, and give TOP 
production. This herd im­
provement program offered 
only by C. O. B. A. Jerry 
Hoenig, Local Technician, For 
service call 241-R-4 or 87 be­
fore 10 a.m. Sundays call 
operator. 47-tf

CUSTOM SPRAYING 
Anything. Anywhere 

Muenster Hatchery, Ph. 63
32tf

UNITED BEDDING CO.
Renovate your old cotton 

mattress into a new inner- 
spring or cotton mattress. Box 
springs to match or bed 
springs. Work guaranteed. All 
mattresses machine made. 1- 
day service. Save up to 50%. 
Ph. H05-3882. 324 N. Com­
merce, Gainesville. 3tf

HAND TOOLS. Big assort­
ment of guaranteed socket 
wrenches, end wrenches, box 
wrenches, p l i e r s ,  cutters, 
screwdrivers, etc., at Com­
munity Lumber Co. 40tf

BONDED, LICENSED 
REAL ESTATE BROKER 

Henry G. Weinzapfel 
Office: Muenster State Bank 

Prepared to accept listings for 
sale or purchase of real estate, 
rental and escrow accounts.

22tf
Mrs. M. J. Endres spent 

Thanksgiving i n Shennan 
with her daughter, Sister 
Irma, and together they went 
to Fort Worth for the week­
end. Mrs. Endres was the 
houseguest of her brother and 
his wife, Mr. and Mrs. Bert 
Fisch.

VFW Auxiliary members 
are reminded to pick up their 
Christmas candy at their earl­
iest convenience, at Dorothy 
Swirczynski’s or Billye Huch- 
ton’s, or come prepared to 
take it home from the Auxili 
ary meeting Monday night.

Mrs. Frank Herr is in 
Gainesville this week with her 
son Ronnie Herr and family.

BONUS DAYS ARE HERE!

DEAL NOW
for your 1960
machinery needs

W ell Pay You a Big
lh  EARLY TRADER'S

B O N U S !
• Collect at the rate of 6 %  on 

your down payment
• Collect 6 %  per annum on 

your trade-in
• Get double value . . .  a cash 

bonus plus IH features, 
quality

• The sooner you deal . . . the 
more you save

Let us figure your deal TO D AY

\\v \ * r v ” '

f l e e

We Expect a 
Good Market

Livestock prices lately have been 
steady at a good level, and indi­
cations are that they will remain 
that way through the week. This 
looks like a good time to bring 
yours in.

Muenster Livestock Auction
Dick Ccrin, Owner and Auctioneer

Am o w /im n
A new service for your farm 

to better serve your needs

Bulk Feed 
Seivice

A

Cleaner, More Convenient, 
Saves Time and Labor

HAVE TRUCK
WILL TRAVEL TO YOUR FARM

Muenster Milling Company
FEED  -  SB ED -  GRAIN -  FER T/LfZER
Pium* 97 Muenster , Texas

Annual Christmas Bargain Offer!

THE DAILY OKLAHOMAN
One Full Year
(313 issues)

By Mail

o o
Oklahoma 

residents odd 
2 %  state 
sales tax

You SAVE $2.40!
• In The Dally Oklahoman you je t mare at everything—  
mare fa read, mare te talk about— mare news, more 
sports, mart women's features, more comics, mare 
Information, mare la Interest every member of the 
family. And i t  this special bargain price, The Dally 
Oklahoman casts only pennies i  day. Send your order 
today!

C ir c u la t io n  D e p a r tm e n t ,
The D a i ly  O k la h o m a n  
O k la h o m a  C i t y  I,  O k l a .

Enclosed f ind  $ _______  (c h e c k  or  m o n e y  o r d e r )  to  co ver
cost o f  o n e -y e a r  m a l l  subscrip t ion  as check ad  b e lo w  to  begin  
im m e d ia te ly ,  or when pres en t  subscript ion exp ires .

NOTE: If this Is I  renewal, please 
enclose present address lib e l.

TH E  D A I L Y  O K L A H O M A N
□  Weekdays Only, 1 Year (313 Issues) by Mail —  J 8.00
□  Sundays Only, 1 Year (52 Issues) by Mail . . . .  J 8.00
□  Daily X Sunday, 1 Year (365 Issues) by Mail —  515.00

This alter expires December 31. 1?5!

N a m t  .  

A ddress

City . . . ............................................................  S ta te

Oklahoma Residents add I X  sales tax.
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Be Practical!
Give Slippers 
for Christmas

FARRAR'S
in Gainesville

MASSEY FERGUSON

65 Diesel
The tractor that is setting new standards 

for 4-plow performance, convenience and 
economy.

Here's a rugged brute of an engine that will 
turn 4 furrows with ease and sets new stand­
ards of work performed per gallon of fuel. It's * 
a 4-cylinder engine with 203.5 cubic inch 
capacity and compression ratio of 17.4 to 1. 
Engineers designed this power plant to take 
heavy loads of hard use over thousands of 
hours of work.

SURE STARTING 
IN SUB-ZERO TEMPERATURES

A turn of th9 key controls both starter and 
heater that warms intake manifold for easy 
starting. And two 6-volt batteries hooked up 
in series provide a 12 volt system for ample 
starting power.

See It! Ask for a Demonstration

Biffle Brothers
Gainesville, Texas

All Together At 
Home This W eek

This week Mr. and Mrs. 
Meinrad Hesse had all their 
children at home at one time 
for a complete family reunion.

Thomas Hesse, just separ­
ated from the Navy after three 
and a half years of service, 
was the reason for the get- 
together. Suzanne Hesse ar­
rived Monday from F o r t  
Worth with a five-day vaca­
tion from St. Joseph’s School 
of Nursing. The other child­
ren at home are Paul Hesse 
who finished four years of 
Navy duty the past September 
and Richard, Eileen, Mary and 
John David.

Relatives Attend 
Nazareth Shower

Seeing their first snow this 
season during the weekend 
were Mr. and Mrs. A1 Walter - 
scheid and Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald Endres and children 
while they visited in Hereford 
as guests of the Frank Wal- 
terscheids.

Saturday night the Muen- 
sterites and the Frank Wal- 
tersoheids and their family 
went to Nazareth to attend a 
gift shower honoring newly­
weds Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Acker of Midland. The party 
was attended by some 60 rela­
tives and friends. It was held 
in the Nazareth Parish Hall.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Fette 
drove over from Waco to 
spend the weekend with his 
family, the Henry Fettes.

Excellent Food 
Properly Served
The CURTWOOD
CURTWOOD Jr.
The COLONIAL

Curtis Restaurants

AN EXTRA SERVICE 
at no extra cost
You can see and 
feel the difference

Sta-Nu
★  e R-*D C E S S

Homogenizes vital 
textile oil back into 

the fabric
W e Give

S&H Green Stamps

MILLER'S
Cleaners & Hatters

Gainesville

Gentle as a whisper, surer than sunshine, your 
automatic gas dryer whisks moisture out 

of clothes with an evenly-heated flow of warm, 
dry air. Costs less to install. No element 

to burn out. Norge dryers last longer, operate 
quieter, dry more efficiently on economical 

gas. Give a Christmas gift to the 
whole family —  and the clothes they wear!

GIVE A NEW NORGE 
AUTOMATIC GAS DRYER I

GUARANTEED RUST PROOF 
A written warranty assures 

you that your beautiful Norge cabinet is 
fully protected against rust.

*  longest guarantee of all: 5-Year Warranty
on the cabinet and all working parts 

except the motor.

I  EXCLUSIVE 4-WAY DRYING, lets you select 
Tumble-drying with Heat and A i r . . .  
Tumble drying with Air, no heat. . .  

Heat and Air drying, no tiynbling. . .  
Air drying, no heat or tumbling! 

A method for any washable fabric!
*  Largest capacity dryer cylinder —  6 cu. ft.

capacity for greater tumbling, less 
tangling. Gives uniform wrinkle-free drying.
*  Big, heavy-duty 21-inch blower fan blows 

clean air through clothes safely, quickly, quietly.
*  Dry 7 loads with gas for the cost of 

drying 1 electrically!

Join the Jimmy Stewarts

Give 
Your 
Family a 
M odem  
Gas
C lothes

Dryer
n o w
o n ly  $ 1 7 9 .9 5
510 down, 36 mo*, to pay

Gtot her a major appliance . . .  Norge folly-automatic GAS

LONE STAR GAS COMPANY

—

Local News
B R I E F S

Mrs. Virginia Carter and 
four children of Mineral 
Wells returned home Sunday 
afternoon following a holi­
day visit with her mother, 
Mrs. Catherine Gehrig and 
other relatives. Mr. and Mrs. 
Charley Heilman entertained 
with a dinner party for her 
sister while she was here.

Prices Good Friday and SaturdayMembers of the C. L. Wil­
liams family were together 
for a Thanksgiving reunion 
and turkey dinner in the par­
ents’ home at Bonita. Maynard 
Williams and his wife and 
their daughter Marianne were 
there from Washington, Mo., 
Mrs. Clint Fletcher and Mike 
came from County Line, Okla., 
the Ray Tempels were there 
from Gainesville and Messrs, 
and Mmes. C. L. Williams Jr. 
and Betty, Henry Huchton and 
J o h n  Huchton and David, 
Suzanne and Lynn attended 
from Muenster.

Mr. and Mrs. Russ Linn had 
as holiday guests their daugh­
ters and families, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Smith and son of 
Dallas and Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Minto and daughter of Law- 
ton, Okla.

Howard Mollenkopf of Texas 
University returned to Austin 
Sunday after spending the 
Thanksgiving holidays with 
his mother, Mrs. George Mol­
lenkopf and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Kathman 
w e r e  Thanksgiving dinner 
guests in the home of their 
daughter and family, the W. 
E. Insels at Gainesville. His 
parents, the Harper Insels, 
were also guests. The Kath- 
mans other daughter and her 
family, the Stan Wylies of 
Lewisville, went to Wichita 
Falls to spend the holiday 
with his parents.

Things are back to normal 
at the A1 Walter home after 
a happy family reunion dur­
ing the holidays. All the out 
of town children—were here. 
Gene Walter came from Birm­
ingham, Ala., Claude Walter 
visited f r o m  Weatherford, 
Okla., and Virgil Walter and 
Mrs. Bill Karr drove up from 
Lubbock.

Mrs. Paul Fisher and her 
mother, Mrs. Frank Kathman, 
and Mrs. Ed Klement returned 
home Monday after a visit 
in Oklahoma City. They took 
Helen Fisher back to St. 
Anthony’s School of Nursing 
and returned Ronnie Klement 
and Eddie McGannon to their 
school in Oklahoma City. 
They left Sunday, visited 
overnight with Mrs. Kath- 
man’s nieces and enjoyed 
window shopping and sight­
seeing Monday.

CITATION BY PUBLICATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS

TO: Jeffery Potts, Defendant, 
Greeting:

YOU ARE HEREBY COMMAND­
ED to appear before the Honorable 
16th District Court of Cooke Coun­
ty at the Courthouse thereof. In 
Gainesville, Texas, by filing a 
written answer at or before 10 
o’clock A.M. of the first Monday 
next after the expiration of forty- 
two days from the date of the is­
suance of this citation, same being 
the 4th. day of Jan. A.D. 1960, to 
Plaintiff’s Petition filed In said 
court, on the 4th day of Nov. A. D. 
1959, in this cause, numbered 18,643 
on the docket of said court and 
styled Ex Parte. Plaintiff, vs. 
Jeffery Potts. Defendant.

A brief statement of the nature 
of this suit is as follows, to-wit: 
Application. To declare one legally 
dead and application for Heirship 
as is more fully shown by Plain­
tiff’s Petition on file in this suit.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the date 
of its issuance, it shall be returned 
unserved.

The officer executing this writ 
shall promptly serve the same ac­
cording to requirements of law, 
and the mandates hereof, and 
make due return as the law dir­ects.

Issued and given under my hand 
and the seal of said court at 
Gainesville. Texas, this the 18th 
day of November A.D. 1959.

(SEAL) Attest: Milton Thomason 
Clerk, 18th District Court Cooke 
County, Texas. By Anna Mae 
Shorter, Deputy.

52-1-2-3

Before you Buy 
Check Our
Prices on

G U L F

T I R E S

and

Garza Twin Fitted

SHEETS
White only

$1.69
81 x 108

SHEETS
Blue or green striped

$1.98

Pastel

W ASH RAGS 

20 for $1.00

42 x 36, White only

PILLOW CASES 

25c ea.

Children's Cotton

PANTIES
Sizes 2 to 6

8 for $1.00

Ladies' Baby Doll

PAIAMAS
Red or black. S-M-L

$1.98

24 x 46 Callaway

TOWELS
Reg. $1.98 value

98c
72 x 90 Chromspun

BED SPREADS 

$8.95

70 x 80 5% wool

BLANKETS
Plaids of rose or blue

$3.98

Boys' 10 oz.

BLUE JEANS
Western cut. 4 to 12

$1.00

Men's Suede Cloth

ROBES
Sizes X - XL only

$2.98

Men's Thermal

UNDERWEAR
2 piece. S-M-L-XL

$1.98 ea.

Men's Fur Lined

GLOVES
$3.98

81 x 108

SHEETS
White only. Slight 

seconds. Limit 4

$149
20 x 40

TOWELS 

4 for $1.00

17 x 25 Feather

PILLOWS

89c

27 x 27 Birdseye

DIAPERS
Hemmed. Ready to use

$1.79 doz.

Reversible Satin

COMFORTS
72 x 84, two tone

$6.95

Ladies' Rayon Tricot

GOWNS
% sleeve. 32 to 46

$2.98 -
Ladies' Land and Sea

BLOUSES
32 to 46. $1.98 value

98c

70 x 80 double

BLANKETS
Cotton plaids

$2.98

Boys' 13% oz.

BLUE JEANS
coarse weave, 4 to 16

$1.98

Men's Broadcloth

PAJAMAS
Sizes A-B-CD

$2.98

Men's

SPORT SHIRTS
Woven Madras

$2.98

Men's Chambray

SHIRTS
Double Yoke. 14 to 17

98c

Garza 81 x 108 or Fitted

SHEETS
All Colors

$2.49
81 x 108 Garza

SHEETS
White only

$1.89

100 lb. size

SUGAR SACKS 

4 for $1.00

22 x 44 Heavy

BATH TOWELS 

2 for $1.00

Fitted

CRIB SHEETS
Solid color or stripes

89c

Indies' Nylon

DUSTERS
Pink or blue. 12 to 18

$3.98

Ladies'

HALF SLIPS
Black, blue, red, pink

98c
Chenille

BED SPREADS
Solid Colors

$2.98

White Sheet

BLANKETS
70 x 95. Irregulars

$1.69

Boys'

SKI PAJAMAS
2 piece. 6 to 16

$1.98

Men's Western

SHIRTS
Square buttons. 14 to 17

$3.98

Men's Medium Weight

SWEAT SHIRTS
White or gray

98c

Men's All Wool

SWEATERS
Brown or blue

$4.98
B A T T E R I E S

Ferd’s
Gulf Station

Muenster

THE
209 N. Commerce B .B . STORE

Gainesville. Texas
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Back for a visit here Satur­

day was Mrs. Opal Jones of 
Bowie who stopped to see Mrs. 
Ray Evans.

DR. A  .A. DAVENPORT

CHIROPRACTOR 
X-RAY FLUOROSCOPE 

301 E. Broadway, G’ville

Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Higgins 
of Myra had as guests for the 
weekend their grandchildren, 
Jerry and Becky Higgins of 
Sherman. Their daddy A. J. 
Higgins Jr., came over for a 
Sunday visit and took them 
back home. Other guests in 
the Higgins’ home Sunday 
were their sons-in-law and 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Bell and Mr. and Mrs. H. W. 
Acker of Gainesville.

Mr. and Mrs. Q. D. Pettigrew 
and children of Kaufman 
spent Wednesday overnight 
and Thanksgiving day with 
her parents and family, the 
John Herrs.

Clifford Swirczynski came 
home from Dalhart to spend 
the s c h o o l  holidays for 
Thanksgiving with his family, 
the Herman Swirczynskis. He 
teaches biology at Dalhart 
High.

Prices Good Friday & Saturday
Del Mcnte No. 303 can 

Cream Style

CORN
6 for $1.00

Del Monte ,No. 303 can

FRUIT 
COCKTAIL

4 for $1.00
Del Monte .No. 303 can 

SUGAR

6 for $1.00
Del Monte. No. 1 Va can

SLICED
PINEAPPLE

5 for $1.00
Oak Farms, Va gal. 

Frozen Dairy Desert

Register this Week for a

T? Portable Electric 
r i 6 6  Sewing Machine

Sewmor Brand, Retail value $219.00 

Priority, No. Va can

Chunk Tuna _ .  4 for $1.00
Prattlow, No 2Va can. Whole

Spiced Peaches . .  _ .  25c
Del Monte 15 oz. pkg.

Seedless Raisins _ _ .  35c
Shurfine 7 oz. pkg.

Macaroni or
Spaghetti .  _ . 2  for 19c

Lustre Creme, $2.00 value

Shampoo . _ _ .  _ $1.59
5-Day, $1.10 size

Deodorant Pads .  _ _ 79c
Colgate 53c size

Dental Cream _ .  2 for 89c

FREE FLASHLIGHT
With the purchase of

Pepsodent Toothpaste _ 69c

TRIM Frozen Foods
3 for $1.00

PLEASE!
Do not bring meat for 

processing during Christ­
mas week. Arrange to do 
your butchering before 
our holiday rush.

Polar, 9 oz. pkg.

French Fries _ .  _ 2 for 29c
Polar, 10 oz. pkg.

Peas and Carrots .  2 for 29c
Chicken of the Sea, 8 oz. pkg.

Tuna Pie _ _ _ 4 for $1.00
Youngblood's 8 oz. pkg.

Chicken Gizzards . _ _ 29c

Meats
Pork Chops _ _ 1b. 39c
Delite

Bacon .  _ .  _ 1b. 39c
Delite Ready to Eat, 10-12 lb.

Hams _ _ .  _1b. 49c

Produce
Extra fancy Winesap

Apples .  _ .4  lbs. 39c
Red

Potatoes .  25 lb. bag 79c 

Bananas _ _ _ lb. 10c

Phone 252

HOFBAUER’S
FOOD & LOCKER SERVICE

Local News
B R I E F S

Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Fletcher 
had as three-day visitors dur­
ing the holidays their daugh­
ter and son-in-law, the William 
Terrells and daughter Toni and 
son Terry and Toni’s friend 
Delores Sherrell, all of Lub­
bock. From here the visitors 
went to Decatur to see his 
family and on to Denton to 
visit the Jack Fletchers.

Kay Fette who is at Holy 
Angels Convent in Jonesboro, 
Ark., had a reunion by phone 
with her family, the Herman 
Fettes, Saturday in observ­
ance of her birthday. Her 
daddy and mother, brothers 
Kenny and Tim and sister 
Linda all joined in the tele­
phone conversation. It was 
Kay’s 15th birthday.

C o l d  weather cancelled 
Muenster Boy Scouts’ week­
end hike and camp-out. 
They’re going to re-set the 
date for the outing.

Visiting here Saturday were 
Mr. and Mrs. John Zihlman 
of Arlington who were guests 
of her sister, Mrs. John Knabe 
and her brother, Ted Grem- 
minger. They had dinner in 
the Gremminger home.

Seeing each other for the 
first time in 29 years was 
quite an occasion for Mrs. M. 
H. King and a former class­
mate at Hood — Mrs. Gamell 
Trammell who was Miss Ila 
Acker before her marriage. 
Mr. and Mrs. Trammell who 
live in San Angelo stopped 
here Friday to visit Mr. and 
Mrs. King, then went to 
Gainesville to visit relatives 
and the two couples were to­
gether again that night in the 
home of Mrs. Trammell’s bro­
ther, W. H. Acker.

The Very Rev. Bonaventure 
Koelzer of Graymoor, N. Y., 
and his sister, Miss Theresa 
Koelzer of Hereford, were here 
over the weekend to visit fam­
ily members and were house- 
guests of their sister, Mrs. 
Lena Streng. Other relatives 
joined them there for a get- 
together Sunday afternoon 
and the visitors returned to 
Hereford Monday morning. 
Father Bonaventure will go 
back to New York from there.

Lou Rena Wolf of Houston 
was at home to spend Thanks­
giving and the weekend with 
her family, the Lou Wolfs.

All’s quite at Mrs. John 
Felderhoff’s home again since 
Saturday when the last of her 
company returned home. Va­
cationing with her were her 
daughters, Mrs. John Wright 
and daughters Rene and Col­
leen of Victoria and the Monty 
Elliotts and daughters Joyce, 
Mary Jane and Carolyn of 
Bushnell, 111. While the visi­
tors were here Mrs. Aubrey 
Jennings and daughter Rose 
came over from Wichita Falls 
to see her mother and sisters. 
The Elliotts saw Mrs. Wright 
and daughters off on the train 
at Dallas, then drove to Irving 
to visit their cousins the Mor­
ton Wrights and family. While 
the visitors were here other 
members of the family were 
in and out almost every day 
to see them.

Three families are in differ­
ent homes this week as the 
result of moves. Starting the 
moving were Mr. and Mrs.
Walter Grewir.g and two
children who occupied their
new home on N. Hickory 
Street during the weekend.
Monday, Deputy Sheriff and 
Mrs. Bill Pratt and two child­
ren moved into the place the 
Grewings vacated on N. Main 
and later in the week Mrs. 
Susie Noggler and family 
moved from a farm on route 4, 
Gainesville, to their home 
which the Pratts vacated.

Sunday visitors with Mr. 
and Mrs. J. A. Sanders were 
their son-in-law and daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter D. Cook 
and son of Fort Worth. Dur­
ing the past week Mr. and 
Mrs. Sanders were in Medford, 
Chickasha, Cement and Shaw­
nee, Okla., on business.

SAVE $5
ON A BICYCLE

Buy it in the carton, assemble 
it yourself. . . and SAVE $5

24 in. Boy's or Girl's Bike 
Reg. price $38.88, Carton price $33.88

20 in. Boy's or Girl's Bike 
Reg. price $29.95, Carton price $24.95

USE OUR LAY-AWAY PLAN
Open Saturdays Until 8

K & E S iS
Gainesville

Notice of intention of the City 
of Muenster. Texas, to enter into 
an amendment to the cooperation 
Agreement with the Housing 
Authority of the City of Muenster, 
Texas.

Pursuant to a Resolution duly 
adopted on October 5. 1959 by the 
City Council of Muenstes, Texas 
Notice is hereby given of the 
intention of the City of Muenster, 
Texas, to execute an Amendment 
to the Cooperation Agreement with 
the Housing Authority of the City 
of Muenster. Texas, and further;

Notice is hereby given that at the 
expiration of sixty (60) days from 
November 27, 1959, the City Coun­
cil of the City of Muenster, Texas, 
will consider the question of 
whether or not it will execute an 
Amendment to the Cooperation 
Agreement with the Housing 
Authority of the City of Muenster, 
Texas. A copy of the proposed 
Amendment is available for the 
inspection of the public at the 
office of the City Clerk during 
business hours.

This Notice is given and pub­
lished pursuant to the Housing 
Cooperation Law of the State of 
Texa‘\

A. F. Luke 
City Secretary 
City o f Muenster

NOTICE
The City Council o f the City 

of Muenster, Texas, will receive 
bids for curb and gutter work in 
and along Walnut Street, begin­
ning at Division Street and con­
tinuing to Sixth Street. All per­
sons or firms, interested in con­
structing said curb & gutter shall 
submit their written bid to the 
City Council on or before the r.th 
day of December 1959, City Coun­
cil reserves the right to reject or 
accept any bid.

A. F. Luke 
City Secretary 
City of Muenster

NOTICE
The City Council of the City of 

Muenster. Texas, will receive bids 
for the paving of Walnut Street, 
beginning at Division Street and 
continuing to Sixth Street. All 
persons or firms interested in con­
structing said paving shall submit 
their written bid to the City Coun­
cil on or before the 7th day of 
December 1959. City Council re­
serves the right to reject or accept 
any bid.

A. F. Luke 
City Secretary 
City of Muenster

Bay

BUTANE 
PROPANE
uith. ewi^idme 

u im p u e e
tta EmMan

Muenster 
Butane Company

Phone 99-J-2

THIS YEAR,  
GIVE A PORTRAIT|t

•  for mother to hang on her wall.
•  for dad at his desk.
•  or to carry in his travels.
•  for someone away at school.
•  or just to say " I  love yo u ."

Don't be disappointed . . .  or more im­
portant, don't disappoint them . . . 
make your appointment now. Just 
phone, call, or write.

Boyd & Breeding
Gainesville

T h e
AMP

. . . . wait ior no man! W hen opportunity 
comes your way, it pays to be prepared. It 
usually takes "cash in the bank" to sieze a 
favorable business opportunity . . .  or make 
an important purchase at an exceptionally 
low price. The only way to HAVE "cash in 
the bank" is to PUT it there . . .  on a syste­
matic schedule of saving.

Open a saving account here and add to it 
every week. Then, when opportunity knocks 
on YOUR door, you'll be ready to take ad­
vantage of it. When money is needed, you'll 
have it!

MUENSTER STATE BANK
Member FDIC

Make This a Merrier Christmas!
Bay ALL Your Gifts 

at TAPPAN'S in Gainesville
Make your Dollar Do Double Duty 

During Tappans Big
SURPLUS STOCK LIQUIDATION

Tappan's MUST LIQUIDATE this entire 
surplus stock by January 1. So . . •

BUY AT YOUR OWN PRICE!
NO REASONABLE CASH OFFER REFUSED!

The Home of 
Fine Diamonds and 

Standard Brands i i P P P u n s
3cna Cw&l MeuwciA
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Lindsay News

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Wachs- 
man and children of Wichita 
Falls were Thanksgiving day 
guests of her parents, the 
Willie Fuhrmanns, also visited 
her sisters at Muenster and 
drove to Sherman to see her

sister, Mrs. A. J. Huchton who 
was there with her sick baby 
at the hospital.

Mrs. Johnnie Arendt was 
hostess in her home for the 
monthly Tripoli party and 
after the games served angel 
cake, ice cream and coffee to 
Mmes. Paul Arendt Jr., Ed 
Wolf, Lee Wolf, Vincent Zim- 
merer, and Andy Arendt, 
members, and one guest, Mrs. 
Frank Krebs Jr.

Supper guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Leonard Bengfort Sun­
day were her parents and 
family, the John Herrs of 
Muenster.

Bruno Zimmerer, accom­
panied by J. C. Bullard of 
Gainesville, spent Tuesday 
afternoon in Dallas attending 
an insurance meeting of in­
terest to Farm Bureau mem 
bers.

Work at the parish cemetery 
continues and Monday was 
a busy day with parishioners 
using shovels and wheelbar­
rows to level fill-in dirt which 
had been hauled in the previ­
ous week.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Schmid- 
lkofer and children Judy and 
Steven were in Decatur to 
h a v e  Thanksgiving dinner 
with her parents, the C. M. 
Flusches. Mr. and Mrs. James 
Flusche and Kathy of Decatur 
were also guests. Evelyn Flus­
che accompanied her sister 
and family home to visit 
through Sunday in Lindsay.

Lindsay High School stu­
dents and Sister Liberia, 
joined by a group of adults, 
have started a course in par­
liamentary law being taught 
by Mrs. Paul Shobe of Gaines­
ville. The group meets each 
Monday night in the school 
cafeteria at 7:30.

Mrs. Henry Zimmerer is 
back at home after a 15-day 
visit in Glen Rose for treat- 
ous skirt that swept into an

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bauer 
have returned from a visit in 
Boonville, Ark., where they 
were guests in the home of 
their son and family, the Cle- 
tus Bauers, and made sight­
seeing trip in the area of Hot 
Springs and Subiaco.

Observes Birthday
A birthday party was held 

Sunday afternoon honoring 
Bernadette Bezner on her 12th 
birthday at the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wm. J. 
Bezner. The honoree’s sev­
enth grade classmates show­
ered her with gifts and en­
joyed games. Birthday cake, 
ice cream and soda pop were 
refreshments.

Patsy Bayer of Fort Worth 
was here to spend the holi­
days with her family, the 
Martin Bayers.

Lindsay PT Group 
Plans Yule Party

Members of the Lindsay 
Parent-Teachers Club in their 
monthly meeting made plans 
for the annual Christmas party 
and Sisters’ shower, and dis­
cussed purchase of equipment 
for the high school football 
team.

The Christmas party will be 
for students, pre-school child­
ren and their mothers. St. 
Anne’s Society is co-sponsor 
for the event.

Mrs. Nick Block who was 
historian last year had the 
attractive scrap book on dis­
play. It has been placed in 
the school library.

The fifth and sixth grade 
room won the attendance 
prize again and will be treated 
to a party this week.

Ed Schaa, president, pre­
sided for the business session 
in the presence of Father Al- 
cuin who led the opening and 
closing prayer.

A f t e r  adjournment, hos­
tesses for the evening, Mmes. 
Junior Stoffels, Bill Eberhart, 
Andy Arendt and Paul Arendt 
Jr., served cake and coffee 
to about 60 members.

Family Together 
For Supper Party

Mr. and Mrs. Tony Hermes 
and family were guests for a 
delicious Thanksgiving sup­
per in Muenster when Mrs. 
Hermes’ mother, Mrs. Alfons 
Koesler Sr., entertained in 
her home. All the Hermes 
family was together for the 
occasion.

The gathering was a fare­
well tribute for twins Cecil 
and Cyril Hermes who left 
this' week Thursday for in­
duction in the armed forces. 
Their brother Mark Hermes 
who is a student at Subiaco 
Academy was also present, 
being at home for the Thanks­
giving holidays.

Mark returned to Subiaco 
Sunday going by car with 
Ray Lewis of Dallas who took 
his son Leslie Ray back to 
the academy. With them was 
Clifford Pels who had spent 
the holidays with his family 
at Muenster. Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Pels took their son and Mark 
as far as Sherman where they 
met the Lewises.

Attend Rites for 
Kin in Fairfield

Members of Mrs. Sophie 
Stoffels’ family went to Fair- 
field to attend funeral services 
for her granddaughter, Shir­
ley C a t h e r i n e  DeFrance, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Franklin DeFrance.

The little girl died at the 
family home Nov. 20, just 
two days before her tenth 
birthday. She had been a 
helpless invalid since her 
birth.

Funeral services were held 
Nov. 21 in Capps Chapel at 
Fairfield with Father E. Brum- 
leu of Palestine officiating at 
the 3 p.m. rites. Burial was 
in Antioch Cemetery.

Survivors in addition to the 
parents are two sisters and 
five brothers and the grand­
parents, Mrs. Sophie Stoffels 
and Mr. and Mrs. John De- 
France.

With Mrs. Stoffels at the 
funeral were Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete Stoffels and daughter 
Jane. Others there included 
Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Shrodes 
and Miss Emma Grace Stoffels 
of Dallas and Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Stoffels of Commerce.

Couple Celebrates 
30th Anniversary

The thirtieth wedding an­
niversary of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Hermes was celebrated at 
the family home on Nov. 26. 
The occasion was made hap­
pier by the presence of the 
couple’s children, Margie of 
TCU and Lennie who teaches 
at Alex H. Spence Junior High 
in Dallas, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Hermes.

Pat B o h a c accompanied 
Margie from Fort Worth and 
the Lawrence Strengs and 
family of Gainesville were also 
present.

Richard Schmitz 
Earns Promotion

Richard Schmitz, formerly 
of Lindsay, and the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Schmitz, has 
been promoted by Nestle Com­
pany and since Sept. 1 is ter­
ritory manager for the busi­
ness. His office is located in 
Houston but his home still 
remains in San Antonio — 
flying time between home and 
office is just 36 minutes.

In his new assignment 
Richard has the responsibility 
of all Nestle business in the 
lower half of the state with 
six salesmen under his jur­
isdiction. He Ms been with 
the company since 1952.

The Charles Davidsons and 
children spent Thanksgiving 
with her parents, the O. B. 
Seigmunds at Walnut Bend. 
Sallie Seigmund of Dallas was 
there too and accompanied 
her sister and family home

to make his Christmas Merrier!
Men's Gifts Galore 

Throughout Our Store

Men's Justin Cowboy Boots 
Men's Bradford Western Hats 
Men's Sewell Sport Coats 
Men's Sewell Suits 
Men's Haggar Slacks

YOUR HE-MAN'S STORE

COMMERCE STREET STORE
R. W . "Pete" Briscoe, Gainesville

The More Efficient Way 
To Pump Your Water

Jensen counterbalanced pumps are similar 
in design to oil field pumps . . . can be 
operated on a Vi H. P. motor instead of the 
usual 1 H. P. motor. Can be used with a 
windmill . . . have water-lubricated stuffing 
box . . . will force water into pressure tank 
or storage tank.

C. D. Shamburger Lumber Co.
Dick Trachta, Mgr., Muenster

RELAX
THEATRE

Friday - Saturday

VICTOR MATURE 
RED BUTTONS 

DAVID NELSON 
KATHY GRANT

The Big Circus'
In CinemaScope 

and Color

Sunday - Monday

CURT JURGENS 
MAY BRITT

"Blue Angel"
In CinemaScope 

and Color

Give the family a gift it will 

enjoy for many years.-

Get a New 1960 Ford
Come nowl W e still have time to get your choice of colors, 

features and accessories before Christmas

Endres Motor Co.
Ph. 44 Muenster, Texas

Choir and Trustee 
Groups Have Treat

Lindsay c h o i r  members, 
joined my their husbands and 
wives, and the church and 
school trustees and their wives 
were treated to their annual 
dinner party last Wednesday 
evening.

Father Alcuin Kubis gave 
the invocation and benediction 
and was toastmaster for a 
short after dinner program. 
Forty-four attended the 5 
o’clock party.

Tables, arranged in a square, 
carried out the Thanksgiving 
theme and were ornamented 
with turkeys fashioned of 
pine cones.

The barbecued chicken meal 
was prepared and served by 
Mrs. Theresa Schreiber, Mrs. 
Norbert Zimmerer and Mrs. 
Pete Stoffels.

Mrs. Adam Wolf Sr. 
Birthday Honoree

A family reunion and cov­
ered dish dinner observed the 
birthday of Mrs. Adam Wolf 
Sr. Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Arendt Jr. as hosts in 
their home. All the honoree’s 
children and grandchildren 
were present and brought a 
shower of birthday gifts.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Hermes 
had just returned from their 
wedding trip and told about 
sight-seeing in South Texas, 
Louisiana, Arkansas and Mis­
souri. They are at home in 
Gainesville now.

Other family members pre­
sent for the celebration with 
the honor guest and her hus­
band and the hosts and their 
family were the Ed, Lee and 
Walter Wolfs and their child­
ren and Johnny Wolf of 
Gainesville and the Adam 
Wolfs Jr. and their children 
from Muenster.

Confetti - * -
that speed yesterday.

This law comes very close 
to presenting a similar situa­
tion. A penalty provided by 
law on or after January 1 is 
charged against a violation 
that happened before that 
date, actually as long as three 
years before. Will it be de­
clared unconstitutional? Let’s 
see.

To our way of thinking the 
penalty provided by this law 
should apply only to violations 
after January 1. As regards 
the insurance rate every

driver should be allowed to 
start with a clean record. 
Since, however, the unde­
served credit to bad drivers 
would be unfair to insurance 
companies the new schedule 
of credits and penalties on

rates should not become ef­
fective until a specified fu­
ture date. There are complica­
tions about clearing the diffi­
culty of course, but the pro­
vision still seems to be un­
constitutional.

To Date W e Have Filled

649,842 Prescriptions
Just as the Doctor Ordered

W a tti R ia l ,  PluiSunacif
Phone H05-4335 Gainesville

BOOKKEEPING
SERVICE

Property, Liability 
and Hospitalization

INSURANCE

Leo Henscheid Insurance Agency
Next Door to Post Office Phone 83-R-2

When he stops to shop . . . 
here, Santa really lights up 
a Merry Christmas for all on 
his list.
You, too, can pick a hand­
some pack of gifts for all 
the family and friends. And 
at special prices, too . . . 
remember, we invite com­
parison with mail order or 
chain store prices.

New Records. .
Including the latest 

Hit Parade selections

SPECIAL 
Luxane 

Fruit Cakes
In handsome metal 

containers

2 lb. 99c

V a r ie t y  S t o r e
Muenster

■*<

SAVE ON YOUR CHRISTMAS BUYING!

Come to Our - - -

Here's another birthday for us, and were observing it 
by bringing you special savings on every furniture 
item in our store.

Come and celebrate with us . . .  by SAVING

SCO TT BROS
MUENSTER. TEXAS


