
Now hanging in the balance it
this community’s chance of get­
ting a small industry. As mat­
ters stand at this time the op­
portunity is still knocking at our 
door, waiting to be admitted, but 
it can’t be expected to remain 
unless a welcome is extended 
soon. Others with more enthus­
iasm are eager to lure the pros­
pect away.

It isn’t that nobody cares, only 
that not enough of us seem to 
care enough. All agree that a 
nice payroll of a few thousand 
dollars a week, amounting to a 
really substantial figure in a 
year, would be wonderful help 
to the area’s economy. But there’s 
too much of the “let George do 
it” attitude. So many would be 
delighted to see the needed in­
dustrial fund established, but 
they are hoping it will be done 
without their help. Though eager 
to leap their share of whatever 
benefits might accrue, they are 
reluctant to share in the risk or 
sacrifice that would produce 
them.

Of course it would be fine if 
a few individuals decided to take 
over the entire project. But since, 
apparently, that isn’t going to 
happen, it becomes the concern 
of a big group of little investors 
It can be done, however, if we 
will get going now and muster 
spirit and confidence on an ex­
tensive scale.

In relation to this opportunity
there are two very important 
considerations that deserve our 
attention First of all we need 
business and industrial growth to 
keep pare with our growing pop­
ulation. For years we have seen 
youngsters moving away because 
we had no jobs to offer them 
Keeping a larger percentage of 
them here, applying their talents 
and energies to our community’s 
welfare, is vital to our continued 
progress.

There's also the trend toward 
fewer and larger farms It’s hap­
pening all over, and Muenster is 
no exception As the trend con­
tinues jobs have to be created to 
occupy persons who leave the 
farms Unless our town can gain 
as fast as the rural area loses In 
population, the community must 
inevitably slip backward.

So. this proposition should be 
the concern of everyone Of the 
business man who hopes for in­
creased volume, of the family 
man whose children will be seek­
ing jobs, of the farmer whose 
expansion eliminates someone's 
opportunity on the land, of the 
worker who wants a job. All have 
a stake in it, an interest so vital 
as to become practically a re­
sponsibility.

Let's hope that community 
apathy will not permit this op­
portunity to slip away. Instead 
let's hope that Interest will be 
revived, setting off a new high of 
community spirit and enthusiasm 
and cooperation, leading to even 
more opportunities. It's possible 
not only to keep more of our 
talent at home but also to attract 
other talent.

One of the wire services a few
days ago carried an interesting 
feature story about Father Greg­
ory Bezy of Walls. Miss., who 
originated the Sacred Heart Auto 
League and placed about four 
million of those little white stat­
ues on dashboards of cars all 
over the nation. Because of the 
greater safety consciousness in­
spired by his little "Silent Pro­
tectors,” Father Bezy has been 
appointed to membership on the 
National Safety Council.

As he put it, the little plastic 
statue with a magnetic base pro­
vides the “spiritual motivation” 
which can play a tremendous role 
in safe driving . . . prayerful 
driving is careful driving. People 
with the statues are expected to 
drive a little more carefully.

Though Father Bezy himself 
makes no such claims, at least 
not in the article, there are many 
who believe that the statue is 
accompanied by a special bless­
ing. They are convinced that the 
respect and devotion shown by 
giving the Blessed Savior an 
honored place in the car merits 
its occupants His special favor 
. . . that He is with them, ready 
to help in an emergency.

While that may be true, it's 
likely that the greater blessing 
takes the form of “motivation," 
as mentioned by Fther Bezy. It’s 
the driver’s attitude, a disposi­
tion to exercise more care and 
judgment, t h e r e b y  avoiding 
emergencies. It might be com­
pared to the blessing that comes 
from prayer, in which case the 
first fruit is to be found in a 
person’s own attitude

Still another blessing is that 
being reaped by the good priest 
himself. His safety inspiring pro- 

(Contir.ued on Page 8)
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Road North of City 
Being Converted to 
Super FM Highway

A vastly improved Farm to 
Market road is in the making on 
the first five miles of the 
state highway north of Muenster. 
By comparison with the former 
pavement it is a sort of super 
FM highway, almost the equiva­
lent of U. S. Highway 82 in the 
Muenster area.

Principal details of improve­
ment include an additional six 
inches of base, an additional 
four feet of width, a new wide 
bridge, and a change in the road’s 
course.

As a starter all of the old as­
phalt surface was removed. Since 
Monday a 6 inch course of 
crushed rock is being added to 
the former gravel base of 6 to 
8 inches, and at the same time 
the road is being widened from 
18 to 22 feet. Ntxt will come 
the shaping job and application 
of topping.

The road was completely 
changed in the low area between 
J. W. Hess and Joe Trubenbach. 
A fill-in raised the road level by 
6 feet and the old narrow bridge 
was replaced by one of the full 
road width. At the top of the hill 
south of the new bridge and 
fill, the hillside was gouged out 
and the road moved ,*ast to 
eliminate a sharp curve.

Austin and Deaten of Dallas 
is the contractor.

WITH THE MEN 
IN SERVICE

Jo las Air Force
Muenster’s most recent enlistee 

in the armed forces is Pat Hess, 
son of Mr and Mrs Albert Hess 
and their second son in the ser­
vice. Pat left this week for lack- 
land Air Force Base to begin 
training in the Air Farce His 
brother Leo Hess is a naval air­
man stationed at Brown Field. 
Calif.
Settled Overseas

Jerry Kriter hss let his family, 
the Alphonse Reiters, know that 
he Is settled at his overseas station 
now, located near Kaiserslautern. 
Germany His new address Is 
PFC Gerald M Reiter. RA 185 
00821; S?th Eng. Co, Depot 
Maint; A PO  227; New York. 
NY.
Home After Three Years

Home for the first time in three 
years is David Endrrs after being 
separated from the Navy follow­
ing duty in Hawaii He’s the 
son of Mr and Mrs R R. Endrrs 
in whose home he entertained 
guests the past week Both were 
enroute to their homes after be­
ing discharged from the service 
David’s Navy chaplain, stationed 
in Hawaii with him. spent two 
days here and a buddy visited 
here a week. The former went 
to Chicago, the latter to Mass­
achusetts
Awaits Assignment

Airman John Caughcy left 
Monday to return to Ramey Air 
Force Base in Puerto Rico, his 
wife Anselma staying here with 
her mother, Mrs. John Kathman, 
until he is assigned. If Airman 
Caughey is assigned in Puerto 
Rico. Anselma will follow. Should 
his new assignment be state-side, 
she’ll join him at his new station. 
It will be about a week before 
they know. The couple came here 
for a five-day visit after he fin­
ished special training in Illionois.
Spends Leave Here

Sailor Ivan Koelzer has ended 
a leave here with his family, the 
George Koelzers and has re­
turned to San Diego for specia­
lized training. The visit at home 
was his first since he entered the 
service in April and came after 
he finished boot training at the 
Naval Training Center. His fam­
ily saw him off for the return 
trip by plane from Dallas to 
California.
Back In Texas

From Dr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Cottle — she’s the former Rita 
Hoenig — comes word that he is 
out of the service, separated 
from the Air Force, after serving 
most of his enlisted period in 
Phoenix, Arizona. The family is 
back in Texas and at home now 
in Ballinger where Dr. Cottle has 
set up offices for practice in the 
medical profession. Their home 
address is 704 Fourth Street.

Tall Com Contest 
Set for Monday by 
County Farm Bureau

A “Tall Corn” contest spon­
sored by the Cooke County Farm 
Bureau Is set for Monday, July 
20 at 9 a.m. at the Farm Bureau 
office.

“Don’t let the Big One get 
away”, farmers of the county are 
urged. "Pull or cut your tallest 
stalks of corn next Monday and 
bring them in. You may be the 
winner.”

Neil Tibbets, county agent, 
and Frank Neu are the chairmen 
of this contest. They say that 
Cooke County this year has some 
mighty fine corn and it’s going 
to be interesting to take its 
measure before some of i* goes 
into silos.

These who do not have corn 
to place in the contest are in­
vited to “come out anyway, and 
see what some of your neighbors 
are growing.”

Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Hofbauer 
visited in Terrell over the week­
end with the Ewald Fuhrmanns 
and baby Michael Hofbauer 
stayed with his grandparents, the 
Clem Hofbauers.

Eugene J. Walter 
Gets Appointment 
To Aviation Agency

The Federal Aviation Agency 
(FAA) has announced the ap­
pointment of Eugene J. Walter 
as a Mechanical Engineer and 
his assignment to the Air Navi­
gation Facilities Division in Bir­
mingham, Ala.

A son of Mr and Mrs. A1 Wal­
ter of Muenster. he is a graduate 
of Texas A & M College with a 
B S. Degree

Mr Walter, as a Mechanical 
Engineer, is now one of the 
many highly trained FAA em­
ployee* in the United States. This 
experienced team of career spec­
ialists, along with the giant web 
of electronic air aids, makes up 
the more than 150,000 miles of 
safe air highways that are used 
by both military and civil air­
craft

In announcing the new ap­
pointment. FAA Region Two Ad­
ministrator L. C Elliott said. “Mr 
Walter has joined the new agency 
created by the Congress in 1858 
The authoritative Federal Avia­
tion Agency, in addition to en­
couraging and fostering the de­
velopment of civil aviation, has 
the task of modernizing the feder­
al airways, directing air traffic 
control of both civil and military 
aircraft, allocating the diminish­
ing airspace, and both issuing and 
enforcing air safety rules ”

Seven Co-Owners 
Near Completion 
Ol Pontoon Boat

A pontoon boat soon to become 
the fishing and recreation head­
quarters of Its seven co-owners, 
is almost ready for launching on 
Lake Texoma For about three 
weeks its construction has been 
the spare time project of its 
owners and a conversation piece 
to dozens of visitors who stop to 
inspect at the building site be­
side the home of Arthur Hess.

The owners are Ray, Arnold 
and Arthur Hess. Earle and Ray 
Otto, Joe Henry Walterscheid and 
Dan Haverkamp.

Built according to a Popular 
Mechanics plan, it is a 20x8 plat­
form resting on two rows of oil 
drums, eight on each side 
Though welded together the 
drums are separate floats, so that 
damage to any one will not af­
fect the buoyancy of the others.

The power unit is a V-8 car 
engine converted into a marine 
engine. The principal feature of 
conversion is the cooling system 
which takes lake water, flows 
it past the mainfold for partial 
warming, then to the motor block 
and back to the lake A trans­
mission with forward and re­
verse gears allows the propeller 
to turn either way. The croft is 
steered by means of a heavy 
nylon cord from steering wheel 
to rudder.

Designed for both safety and 
comfort it has a heavy rail of 
welded rods all around and a 
roof covering about half of its 
area. Seating equipment will be 
regular chairs which can be 
moved about freely on the sturdy 
flat floor. Over the motor is a box 
like cover, hinged for easy 
access to the power plant but 
serving as a convenient table 
when it is down.

Total weight, according to spec­
ifications is about 3,000 pounds, 
and the pontoons will normally 
be only a few inches in the water. 
The speed is estimated at 10 to 
15 miles per hour.

In Muenster to spend a two- 
week vacation are Mr. and Mrs. 
T. J. Gorman and six children 
of Rockford, 111. They arrived 
Tuesday by train, are house- 
guests of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Werner Endres, and will be 
visiting all members of the fam­
ily.

Local Option Vote 
Awaits Re-Hearing 
By Supreme Court

The course of action to be 
taken here regarding legalized 
sales oi alcoholic drinks is known, 
but the date for getting it in 
motion still is not known.

Mayor Herbert Meurer made 
inquiries Monday and learned 
that a final ruling on the legality 
of a wet city or precinct in a 
dry county is being delayed. Ac­
cording to his information, dry 
interests have asked for a re­
hearing on the state supreme 
court’s ruling which was handed 
down early in June. Until the I 
matter is re-considered, and the | 
former decision is either affirmed 
or reversed, no legal action can 
be taken. It is believed that the 
final ruling will be announced 
in the next few weeks 

Assuming the former decision is 
affirmed, the residents of Muen­
ster will be free to proceed with 
their local option election plans. 
The first step is to prepare a 
petition asking for the election 
and bearing signatures of at 
least 25 per cent of the number 
of the city's qualified voters in 
the last general election The 
petition is to be submitted to the 
county judge, who will order the 
election

Mayor Meurer said present 
sentiment seems to favor beer 
sales in all forms and liquor 
sales in package stores.

Weinzopfel Reviews 
Clear Creek Plans 
In Denton Paper

A featured article In this year’s 
Soil Conservation edition of the 
Denton Record-Chronicle, is an 
outline of the history snd pur­
pose of the Clear Creek Water­
shed Association written by J. 
M Welnzapfe!. president of the 
organization

Mr Weinzapfel recalls that the 
association was formed at Roaston 
on September 10 1957. and a
great deal of progress has been 
made since that time. Fifty five 
sites have been chosen for flood 
retarding structures and twenty 
of the projects are waiting now 
for easements to authorize the 
work. He also pointed out that 
proposed flood control work was 
turned down by the Boll Con­
servation Service several veers 
ago because too IItile had been 
done to retard run-off at the 
source That fault has been cor­
rected since and the danger of 
excessive siltation in reservoirs 
has been eliminated

Also explained It the newly 
formed Clear Creek Watershed 
Authority created this yeer by 
the Texas legislature The Au­
thority is legally empowered to 
collect taxes. If necessary, to 
obtain funds for maintaining 
flood prevention structures Un­
der present SCS regulations It 
is a must in a flood prevention 
program, because reservoirs con 
not be built until provision has 
been made to maintain them.

4th Degree Assembly 
Installs Officers and 
Has Buffet Supper

Formal installation of officers 
featured the business meeting of 
the Fourth Degree Knights of 
Columbus here Sunday afternoon 
with Rodney Hardy of Longview, 
master of district three, as install­
ing officer. Afterwards Knight 
Hardy was the honor guest at a 
buffet supper. Both events were 
held in K of C Hall.

Knights were joined by their 
ladies for the social event and a 
total of 33 attended. The bar­
becued chicken meal was catered 
by Mrs. Joe Lehnertz. Tables 
were attractively covered with 
green and white checked linen 
and held arrangements of sum­
mer flowers through courtesy of 
Mrs. Nick Miller.

Local Faithful Navigator John 
Mosman, in . the name of the as­
sembly, presented the installing 
master with a set of cuff links.

While Mr. Hardy was with the 
Knights at their business meet­
ing, Mrs. Hardy was a guest in 
the J. M. Weinzapfel home and 
Mrs. Weinzapfel arranged a 
bridge party for her.

Treasure Hunts to 
Start Saturday at 
Swimming Pool

A weekly Treasure Hunt for 
the kiddies will be introduced at 
the swimming pool Saturday and 
will continue for the rest of the 
season.

Manager George Petrus an­
nounced this week that several 
dollars in coins will be scattered 
in the pool and children will be 
permitted to keep what they can 
find. The hunt will start at 2 30.

To make it fair for all, goggles 
will not be permitted until 4 
o’clock. After that kids can put 
on their goggles and go after the 
remaining coins.

Vital Meeting on 
Factory Project 
Dated for

NEWS OF SICK 
AND INJURED

Friday

Henry Luke sends v'ord from 
the VA Hospital in McKinney 
that he is responding to treat­
ment, improving in health, but 
doctors haven’t told him how 
long he’ll have to stay. He is in 
Ward 60

Mrs. Eddie Krah) underwent 
surgery Tuesday at WiUon-Joncs 
Hospital in Sherman and is re­
ported recovering normally. She 
will be a patient there about ten 
days

Billy Joe Miller is still favor 
ing his right hand and hasn’t 
gone beck to his regular work 
routine since an accident on July 
8 that almost cost him his index 
finger and cut three other fing­
ers. He was working on a truck 
and got too close to the fan. The 
severity of the cuts kept him in 
Gainesville Sanitarium four days 
for treatment.

Baptist Revival to 
Open Sunday Night

A two-week revival will begin 
Sunday, July 19, at Muenster 
Baptist Church with the Rev. Joe 
Gore of Grand Saline in charge 
of services.

Revival preaching will be 
heard each evening at 8 o’clock.

The Jerome Pagels and Dick 
Cains left Monday for a two 
weeks vacation trip to Florida.

Safety Makes Sense 
Is 1959 Slogan for 
Farm Safety Week

College Station — National 
Farm Safety Week has been de­
signated for July 19-25, says the 
Texas Farm and Ranch Safety 
Council, with the emphasis this 
year on “Safety Makes Sense". 
Farm families who continually 
include safety in their plans and 
work are aware that “safety 
that saves makes tense”. Safe 
farming and living saves time, 
money, sound bodies, carefree j 
hours and even lives, the Council 
says.

Farm work accidents claim 
about 3.500 lives each year, more 
than any other major industry 
About 12.000 farm residents lose 
their lives each year In all types 
of accidents, and another million 
or more suffer accidental injur­
ies. The accompanying disabil­
ities. miseries and financial trou­
bles emphasize that "Safety 
Makes Sense,” says the Council.

Human faihire. not motor ve­
hicles. farm implements snd 
animals, is the basic cause of ac­
cidents In nearly every case, hu­
man failure to recognize and Cor­
rect a hazard Is the real cause 
of accidental death and injury 
Human failures include hurry, 
lack of common sense, improper 
equipment, improper care and 
use of equipment, procrastina­
tion, false confidence, and lack 
of knowledge, states the Council.

Obviously most, if not all, farm 
accidents can be prevented. It 
is a fact that in states where 
good safety committees with well 
planned, active programs are in 
existence, accident rates have 
been reduced. National Safety 
Week has been an important fac­
tor in bringing about this re­
duction. and each year the ef­
fectiveness of this week-long 
campaign becomes more and 
more apparent, the Council adds.

Wilde Wins 1 Week 
Trip to Hawaii in 
Chevrolet Contest

Ray Wilde learned this week 
that he is one of the lucky 
Chevrolet car dealers winning an 
all-expense air trip to Hawaii 
for himself and his wife for a 
full week.

Ray was high point man on 
new car sales in his district dur­
ing May and June when the con­
test was in progress. It war a 
nation-wide contest and winners 
from all over the United States 
will be entertained first In Los 
Angeles, Calif., with a send-off 
party before boarding their plane 
for the Islands. The Wildes will 
be traveling with at least one 
couple they know. Bob Parsons 
of Gilmer, State Deputy of Texas 
Knights of Columbus, was win­
ner in his district.

Whether or not Muenster will 
get its dress factory depends to 
a great extent on a meeting set 
for Friday night at 7:30 in the 
city hall. The purpose of the pow 
wow Is to put new life on a fund 
raising campaign which now lags 
at about 25 per cent of its goal

Announcement of the meeting 
was made Tuesday by Urban En­
dres, temporary chairman of 
Muenster’s proposed industrial 
fund. Especially wanted are all 
the solicitors who formerly agreed 
to serve on the fund raising com­
mittee Any others who would 
like to help, or those just wanting 
to know more about the project, 
are invited to come.

After the delay of several 
weeks this meeting becomes 
practically an emergency. The 
man who is interested in locating 
his plant here is getting con­
cerned about the community's ap­
parent lack of interest At the 
same time a committee from an­
other city is working hard to in­
fluence the prospect in its favor. 
Chances are strong for Muenster 
people to lose an opportunity un­
less they go all out to make up 
for lost time.

The procedure for this pro­
ject it to set up an incorporated 
industrial foundation which will 
make a non-interest loan of 
$25,000 to the plant The loan is 
to be secured by a mortgage on 
equipment and repayment will be 
spread over the next five years. 
As money comes back it is to be 
invested in bonds or a savings 
account and its earning* applied 
to the foundation's charter and 
administrative costs.

Membership in the foundation 
is offered at a minimum of $100 
which is to remain in the fund 
for five years. At the end of that 
time the member has an option 
to draw cut his investment, or 
his pro rata portion if the full 
amount is not available.

When collections are in the 
committee will apply for a char­
ter creating a non profit foun­
dation and directors will be 
elected from the list of stock­
holders

Building And 
Improvement Notes

Returned from a week’s vaca 
tion, Brother Thomas Moster re­
ports an enjoyable time in Fort 
Worth as the guest of Father 
Patrick Hannon.

Bill Lutkenhaus is tearing 
down his house and salvaging 
materials for the new 3-bedroom 
home which will be started as 
soon as the site is cle«r.

Joe Fuber is building a com­
bined carport and storage shed 
at the south side of his house on 
Mam Street opposite the church.

Carpenters are finished with 
their framework and roof and in 
the dry at John Huchton's re­
modeling job. Included are the 
addition of 2 rooms and a bath, 
central heating and lots of 
changes in the rest of the house. 
■  A new outside paint job has 
just been started at Emil Roh­
mer’s.

For Ray Sicking, a new com­
bined hay bam and feed shed of 
sheet metai. Measures 100x58.

Work Specimens by 
German Craftsmen 
Displayed in Bank

Specimens of woodcarving by 
two German craftsmen now lo­
cated at Lindsay are on display 
|. . . and on sale . . .  at the Muen­
ster State Bank. In response to 
an offer from J. M. Weinzapfel 
the two men placed about a dozen 
of their articles in a show case 
in the bank’s lobby.

The artists are L. Kieninger 
and G. A. Goetz, native Germans 
now following their trade in a 
shop at the Schmidlkofer farm 
near Lindsay. They moved from 
Germany to South America some 
five years ago and moved to 
this country several weeks ago.

Articles on display at the bank 
are crucifixes, madonna statues, 
a deer and an ash tray. The men 
specialize in statues, crucifixes, 
relief plaques, trays, and carving 
of animals.

Vacationing here this week are 
Mrs. Townsend Miller and child­
ren of Austin who are guests of 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Swirczynski. Before coming to 
Muenster they visited in Gaines­
ville with Mr. Miller’s mother and 
he joined them there for the 
weekend.

Janice Klement has arrived for 
a month’s vacation with her fam­
ily, the Ray Klements. She came 
from New Orleans where she 
had a special course in nursing 
and will return to Dallas to fin­
ish at St. Paul’s Hospital.
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ELECTRIC

The eltcrrif ty t (which ha» been u'fd for 
years lo turn street tights on and off 
automatically) controls the light.. . turns J 
it on at dush .... off at dawn. w

•  CONTROLLED I Y  ^
PHOTO ELECTRIC CELL £  *’

• INITIAL 10W COST
• WIDE CHOICE Of STYLES

COSTS LESS A Ready-lite, using a 40-watt bulb,
giving you o sbft cheerful light all night, costs less than 
?Sc per month to operate.*-

Prices G ool
Nabisco 1-U>. pkg. 

CHIPAROONS 
CHOC. FUDGE 
or DATE NUT

Cookies 
3 pkg. $1.00

Shurfinc

Shortening
3 lb . can 59c

1 Friday and Saturday

Dixie Belle

Crackers, lb. . . . _ . 19c
Bama 20 oz. tumbler

Red Plum Jam . .3  for $1.00
Reg. 37c size. 24 os. Niagara

Instant Starch . _ . . . 31c 
Cheerios, 10 oz. box . . 27c 
Wheaties 12 oz. box . _ 27c
Cutzite 125 ft roila

Wax Paper . . .  _ 2 for 49c
Reg. 49c size Mrs. Baird's

Angel Food Cake . _ .39c
Reg. 60c far

Lustre Creme Shampoo . 39c

Hl-C 46 os. can

ORANGE DRINK
4 for $1.00

Libby'a No. 303 can

FRUIT
COCKTAIL
4 for $1.00

Frozen Food
Polar Peas, 10 oz. .2  pkg. 29c
Morton's 22 os.

Apple or Cherry Pie . 3 for $1.00
Booth s 10 os.

Breaded Shrimp . . . .  59c
Patio

Mexican Dinner . . . .  49c

Birdseye 1 os. Frosea 
BEEF. CHICKEN 

or TURKEY

Pot Pie 
4 ior $1.00

Produce Meats
Big yellow Delite Ready to-Eat

Bananas lb . !10c Picnics lb . 29c
Sunkist

LEMONS . . do?
Bulk

38c FRANKS .3  lbs. $1.00
California Thompson

Seedless Grapes J
Delite

b. 19c Bacon, 1 lb. tray . . 49c
While Onions _ . lb. 5c Lard, 3 lb. ctn. . . 39c

AUDRA’S BEAUTY SHOP
307 E. Pocan — HC5-4025 — Gainesville

Reg. $35.00 w a v e ____ $17.50
Reg. $25.00 w a v e ____$12.50
Reg. $20.00 w a v e ____$10.00
Reg. $17.50 w a v e ______ $8.75
Reg. $15.00 w a v e ______$7.50
Budget w a v e s_$5.50 6> $6.50

Special attention given to gray, fine or abused hair 
Make your appointment early with Audra 

30 years of experience

PHONE 252

HOFBAUER’S
FOOD & LOCKER SERVICE

Guaranteed Permanent W aves 
HALF PRICE

SOLD AND INSTALLED IY  THE FOLLOWING:

Community Lumber Co.
Phone 49 Muenster

Observes Birthday
A group of classmates helped 

Margie Schoech celebrate Sun­
day when she was 16 years old. 
The birthday observance was ar­
ranged by her mother, Mrs. Andy 
Schoech, and consisted of a swim 
party at the local pool from 5 to 
7, then a wiener roast and b irth­
day cake and ice cream on the 
patio at the Schoech home.
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In All 
The World
No one Is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you.

c e o .  jl

Carroll
*. SON

In California a* 
Hess-Vogel Wedding

Albert Hess took a short vaca­
tion to California, going for the 
purpose of attending the wed­
ding of his son, Airman Leo 
Hess and Mary Lou Vogel on 
July 11.

He phoned home after the wed­
ding to tell his family that the 
nuptial mass was held at 9 a.m. 
in the San Diego Naval Base 
chapel and that he’d give more 
details after he got back He 
spent Sunday visiting former 
Muensterite Norbert Henscheid 
and his family at La Puente, and 
was helping the newlyweds get 
settled at Chula Vista in their 
two-bedroom apartm ent 12 miles 
from Brown Field where Leo is 
stationed. Mary Lou works in an 
aircraft plant at Chula Vista.

Just what you've 
been looking for in . . .

School U niform
SLACKS
Tli© boys will get 70 per cent extra wear from 

this blend of 25 per cent nylon and 75 per cent 
cotton. It's a  wash and wear fabric that needs little 
if any ironing, sanforized and color-fast vat dyed 
Regulars or slims in sizes 4-16 and 28-36.

ALSO - - -

Gray Cotton Slacks
Sanforized. Sizes 4-16 and 28-36. And . . .

Uniform Materials
Big selection for shirts, blouses, skirts.

We give S&H Green Stamps

Pagel’s Store

Blessed Events

Maurice P ogeJ. M>

Mr. and Mrs. Rufus Henscheid 
announce the arrival of Johnny’s 
baby sister, weight seven pounds 
15 ounces. She was born at 
Muenster Clinic Sunday, July  12, 
12:15 p.m. Her grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Henscheid, 
Muenster, and Mrs. Will Bier- 
schenk of Valley View. Mrs. 
Joseph Flusche of Lindsay is the 
great-grandmother.

Fredrick Alfons, weight nine 
pounds seven ounces, arrived 
Friday, July 10, for Mr. and Mrs. 
Norbert Koesler. He was bom 
at Muenster Clinic at 4 am . 
Others welcoming him are three 
brothers and three sisters and 
his grandparents, Mrs. Alfons 
Koesler and Mr. and Mrs. August 
Walterscheid. Father Martin Fis­
cher officiated at the christening 
service and Mr. and Mrs. Alfons 
Koesler Jr. are their nephew's 
godparent;.

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Koelzer have 
announced a seven pound seven 
ounce boy, a brother for Beverly, 
Earl Jr. and Louis. The little bro­
ther arrived at Gainesville Sani-1 
•arium Friday. July 10, 11:33 p.m | 
His grandparents are Mr. and | 
Mrs. George Koelzer. Muenster, j 
and Mr. and Mrs Matt Fuhr-1 
mann. Lindsay.

From Orange. Texas, comes an-1 
nouncement of the birth of a j 
daughter to Ens and Mrs. Bill | 
Tilger — she’s the former Anna 
Grance Fetle — for the new ] 
habv Is a sitter for Matt She: 
weighed six pounds six ounces 
upon arrival Sunday. July 12. | 
S am  Mrs. Kate Reynolds is the | 
maternal grandmother and the 
irreat-erandn*rent* are Mr and 
Mrs. John Fette and Gus Knabe i 
’Hie paternal grandparents live 
in Trenton.

Mrs. Frank Seyler recently be­
came great-grandmother again 
when Margie arrived In Torrence j 
Calif , for Mr and Mrs William 
Neil Mrs Neil is the former 
Therese Henmgan F o r m e r  
Muensterites Mr and Mrs H. P. I 
Hennigan of Albuquerque are! 
the maternal grandparent* The 
Neils have one other child, a boy 
named Willie

Mary Weinzapfel registered for 
the second summer semester at 
NTSC in Denton Monday and re­
sumed classes Tuesday

H. 0. Kinne, O.D.
OPTOMETRIST 

210 F. Calif.. Gainesville
State License No. 26
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DON’T BUY FROM US!
. . . unless you want the latest in 
1959 Fall styles.

J u s t  A r r iv e d :
Men's Fall Suits 

*39 .95  and *45 .00
Come in and compare with other clothing much 

more expensive

COMMERCE STREET STORE
R. W. Brisco*. G cdnecrllle

James Klement and
Rose Ann Vance are 
Married in Dallas

Rose Ann Vance and James 
Klement were married Saturday 
in St. Edward’s Church at Dallas 
with the Rt. Rev. Msgr. John P. 
Brady officiating at the 6 p.m. 
double ring service and nuptial 
mass.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond B. Vance 
of Dallas and the groom’s parents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Albert Klement 
of Gainesville. He is the grand­
son of Mr. and Mrs. John B. Kle­
m ent of Muenster.

For her wedding the bride 
chose a gown of Chantilly lace 
over tulle and satin designed 
with r scalloped portrait neck­
line embroidered with pearls and 
sequins. The skirt swept into a 
diamond-shaped train. A crown 
of tulle petals and pearlized 
orange blossoms held her finger­
tip veil of illusion and she carried 
orchids and stephanotis.

Mrs. Henry Maher, sister of the 
bride was maid of honor, Sallie 
Sorrells was bridesmaid and 
Mary Kathleen Maher was flower 
girl. Paul Klement was his bro­
ther’s best man and Carl, Joseph 
and John Vance, brothers of the 
bride, and Henry Maher were 
groomsmen and ushers.

A wedding reception in the 
Maher home preceded the newly­
weds’ departure on a wedding 
trip. They will live at Fort Camp­
bell. Ky., where ho is in the ser­
vice as a member of the para­
troops. He was graduated from 
Subiaco Academy in Arkansas 
and his bride is a graduate of 
St. Edward’s Academy.

Muenster relative* at the wed­
ding were John B. Klement and 
Messrs, and Mme*. Rody Kle­
ment, J. A. Klement and Buddy 
Reiter Other relative* present in­
cluded Mr and Mrs. Henry Lut- 
tmer and Mrs A1 Reiter of 
Gainesville.

After the festivities the Muen­
ster group got together for an 
evening visit with Mr and Mrs. 
Dick Schleicher who came from 
Garland-

Ending a three-week vacation. 
Mrs. John Myrick and sons Tom­
my and Dolphy returned to their 
home in Houston but little Carol 
Myrtck stayed for an extended 
visit with her grandparents here 
and in Gainesville.

C H I L D R E N  S D R E S S E S

Peaches ’n Cream’s a-iivi Baclc-to-School dresses. For 
Indian summer wear the Avondale tiny check with sleeves 
or the Galey Lord plaid sleeveless dress. On windy fall 
days add the smart jackets of matching solid colors trimmed 
with the dress material.

$4.98 to $7.98

V ,  itAJL
i *

A .

Carol Hess Heads 
CYC as President

Election of officers for a new 
year placed Carol Ann Hess as 
head of the local Catholic Youth 
Council. Others elected to work 
with the new president are Billy 
Frank Richter, vice president; 
Carolyn Swirczynski, secretary; 
Anthony Knabe, treasurer; Eun­
ice Knauf, chairman of the spir­
itual committee; Janie Endres 
and Betty Ann Dangelmayr, co- 
chairmen of the social committee; 
and Jane Hesse and LuAnn Rei­
ter co-chairmen of the member­
ship committee.

Ruth Endres, retiring president, 
conducted the business session in 
the parish hall and a social hour 
with refreshments concluded the 
evening. Door prizes were won 
by Billv Joe Dangelmayr and 
Louise Noggler.

Vic Hartmcms Have 
Good Luck Fishing

A 21-inch Red Fish that Vic 
Hartman caught fishing at Cor­
pus Christi was pretty enough 
to be mounted and shown to 
friends but v/as used for a fish 
fry instead. Vic and Margaret 
and daughter Patsy caught a lot 
of fish on their eight-day vaca­
tion trip. They had good luck and 
spent much of their time fishing 
First at Three Rivers where they 
were guests of the Leo Hartmans, 
then at Corpus.

I.eo Hartman and his daugh­
ter Mrs. Frank Foster and child­
ren accompanied their Muenster 
relatives to Corpus Christi for 
fishing and swimming in coast 
waters. Also to Ban Antonio 
where they enjoyed sight-wing 
Enroute home the Hartmans 
stopped in Glen Rose to see the 
Ed Kocel family.

While they were at Three Riv­
en  they also enjoyed a visit with 
the Elmo Hartmans of Victoria 
and Tom Hartman of Corpus 
Christi who visited in their par­
ents' home.

For Mrs Hartman the Sunken 
Gardens with their lovely flow­
ers were outstanding on the tour 
of the Alamo City. For Patsy the 
zoo was especially interesting

Sunday Mr and Mrs Keith 
Tompkins and children of Fort 
Worth were visitors in the Hart­
man home to hear about her 
parents' trip Monday they left 
for Ringgold.

Farm Bureau Slates 
Meeting and Queen 
Contest for August

Cooke County Farm  Bureau 
directors have set the annual 
barbecue and queen’s contest for 
mid August, the exact date and 
place to be announced later.

Co-chairmen of -the queen’s 
contest are Mrs. Ben Davis and 
Mrs. L. G. Gentle. Their assist­
ants are Mrs. A1 Hess, Mrs. Paul 
Fisher and Mrs. Gus Lutkenhaus 
of Muenster, Mrs. Joe B. Hundt 
and Mrs. Bruno Zimmerer of 
Lindsay, Mrs. Charles Myers and 
Mrs. R. C. Doss of Valley View, 
Mrs. Joe Krahl and Mrs. Harvey 
Watson of Downard-Fairplains 
and Mrs. R. B. Durham and Mrs. 
J. J. Richardson of Rosston.

W alter Nortman will be in 
charge of recreation for the an­
nual social and Bruno Zimmerer 
is chairman of the foods commit­
tee.

An added feature introduced 
by the Farm Bureau this year 
is a ‘T all Corn Contest” with de­
tails to be worked out by Frank 
Neu of Valley View and County 
Agent Neil Tibbets. Talk of 
county farmers about tall com 
this year prompted the contest.

In other business at the 
bureau’s meeting. Melvin Dansby 
of Bowie, field director of Dis­
trict 4. said it’s time to start 
work or resolutions and recom­
mendations to be sent to the 
state meeting in San Antonio in 
November. G u s  Lutkenhaus. 
chairman of the P. D. committee, 
has asked members to contact 
their neighbors to see what kind 
of legislation they want to bring 
before the meeting.

The livestock committee, con­
sisting of Glenn Heilman. Neil 
Tibbits, Ben Davie, Paul Fisher. 
George Berry and Weldon Ber­
ner, were asked to meet and 
work out a program pertaining 
to brucellosis control and eradira- , 
tkm.

Members also made plans to 
attend the Farm Bureau State 
Institute in Dallas August 3-5.

Mary Lou Martin 
And Wylie Edwards 
Say Wedding Vows

Wedding vows were said in 
Forestburg Baptist Church at 2:30 
Sunday afternoon by Mary Lou 
Martin and Wylie Edwards. The 
single ring ceremony was per­
formed by Rev. Cletus Ice, pas­
tor.

Parents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. C. W. Martin of Muen­
ster and Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Edwards of Forestburg.

The couple was attended by 
Janet Sills as maid of honor and 
James Peyrot as best man. Rel­
atives and friends attended the 
service.

Mary Lou attended Muenster 
Public School but transferred to 
Forestburg High for her last year. 
Wylie was granduated from For­
estburg High. They will make 
their home near Forestburg in 
the Gene Lanier house.

61st Anniversary
There was no special celebra­

tion but relatives and friends re­
membered July 10 as the wedding 
date of Mr. and Mrs. Tom Pryor 
of Mvra and stopped by to say 
congratulations and wish them 
a very happy 61st anniversary. 
Among well-wishers were the 
couple’s niece and her husband 
Mr and Mrs. M. H. King.

75 oTREAHPicnic
Employees of Cooke County 

Electric Cooperative had their 
annual picnic and swim party at 
City Park Saturday evening and 
took their families along to share 
in the fun. Barbecued chicken 
was prepared by J. W Fisher and 
Mrs Joe Lehnertz catered the 
meal for the group of 75.

TAPPANS
YOUR CREDIT JEWELERS 

Fine Watch
and Jewelry Repairing 

119 N. Commerce. Geiaeevilte

Shoes 
For The 

Entire Family

HARTMAN'S 
SHOE STORE

Muenster, Texas

W HICHEVER SHE PREFERS. . .  
Finest Quality She Can Obtain a t

T S O  G ives H er th e  
the M ost Reasonable Cost

Parents have the responsibility of protecting 
the precious eyes of their youngsters. To be 
sure your teenagers receive only the finest 
in eye care and eyewear, put your confidence 
in the experienced Doctor* of Optometry 
at TSO.
Either regular glasses or amazing Micro­
sight Contact Lenses . . .  whichever is pre­
ferred — TSO always provides the finest 
quality obtainable at the most reasonable 
cost.

S a i u ja c tio H ' Q u a b a h U m d

Directed by Dr. S. i .  Rogers, Dr. N. Joy Rogers 
_________________ Optometrists .

CONTACT LENSES S55“»
Formerly priced at $99 00.

Cost as much as $125 to $185 ELSEWHERE

CONVENIENT CREDIT

FINIST QUALITY

S S  LENSES................$11.85
Complete With Examination

vuS: CLASSES A . U . A ,  $14.85
Complete With Frame, Lenses 

and Examination

Pay *1 Weekly
o iso, \ m

108 East California 
GAINESVILLE. TEXAS

See "DEADLINE"
W ednesdays, 9:30 p.m. WBAP-TV
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"WHAT CAN I DO?"
;y Tom Anderson, Editor 

Farm and Ranch 
“What can I do?” That’s the 

quesction more and more patri­
otic Americans are asking. “What 
can I do to save my country from 
bankruptcy, defeat, and slavery?” 

You can do plenty. If America 
can be saved from becoming a 
aocialist-labor-welfare dictator­
ship it can only be saved by a 
revolution at the grassroots. Our 
nation can be saved the same 
way it was founded, by rebellious 
patriots demanding a return to 
home rule. Our state governments 
have almost entirely lost their 
sovereignty and have become 
weak, hungry, competing pan­
handlers for the federal syndicate.

Here are some things we need 
to do to save America: (We must 
save the world but the only way 
to do that is to save America.)

First, kill the federal personal 
income tax This is the one most 
vital thing we can do. It would 
automatically solve many of our 
problems.

The federal income tax law 
threatens to lead us to complete 
federal dictatorship, yet the left­
wingers say maybe we haven’t 
raised taxes enough The same 
New Deal Socialist crowd who 
argued for years that we could 
spend ourselves rich now believe 
we can tax ourselves richer 

Sell to the highest bidder the 
700 federal, tax-free, rent-free 
interest-free corporations which 
lose 10 billion dollars a year.

Limit the peacetime debt now 
If they can't tax it or borrow it, 
they can’t spend it. Compel an 
annually balanced budget and 
retire the national debt Curb the 
Supreme Court Drastically re­
duce U. S aid to friendly foreign 
countries. Eliminate tt to enemies 
like Tito, Russia's Trojan Horse 
A friend bought it not worth the 
price paid. Kill federal granta-in- 
aid to state and local govern­
ments and substitute state grants- 
in-aid to the Federal Govern­
ment Drastically reduce aid to 
veterans not disabled in war. Re­
verse the trend in Legislative. 
Executive, and Judicial brances 
of the Federal Government to 
take over and supplant local 
self-government with a federal 
bureaucracy so vast that it is be­
yond the understanding and the 
reach of the people Protect the 
rights of the states to run their 
own affairs.

PayA*W *Go
Kill the present Social Security 

System and install in its place a 
pay-as-we-go Social Security 
System.

Excellent Food 
Properly Served
The CURTWOOD 
CURTWOOD JR. 
The COLONIAL

Curtis Raatauitmts

Any erroneous reflection  upon the 
character, standing or rep u ta tio n  at 
any  person, firm  or corporaU un th a t 
m ay appear In the colum ns • !  the 
E nterprise  w ill be gladly and  fully 
corrected  upon being b rough t to the 
a tten tion  of the Publisher.

Do away with Postal Savings 
System, which competes unfairly 
with banks, and save $6,300,000. 
Demand return to a stable and 
sound dollar. Increase Parcel Post 
lates to cover indirect costs and 
save $50,000,000 End the loans 
for college housing, thus saving 
$146,910,000. Set up a single, 
civilian-manned commission to 
buy all non-combat materials for 
all three branches of the armed 
services. Centralize control over 
disposal of government surplus.

Give up our pet projects: postal 
subsidies, business subsidies, air­
port subsidies, highway subsidies, 
veteran subsidies and so on, until 
we can pay-as-we-go.

Protect us from treaties, ex­
ecutive agreements, and secret 
diplomacy by passing the original 
Bricker amendment. Get the Fed­
eral Government out and set the 
farmer free. Give Red China a 
seat in the United Nations — our 
seat. Outlaw the Communist Par­
ty. Communism is a godless re­
ligion, a conspiracy which mas­
querades as a political party. Re­
duce the military establishment 
drastically, at home and abroad. 
Sixteen thousand Pentagon jobs 
are double-staffed, for instance.

Cut off trade and relations with 
Communistic nations and their 
satellites. Form new clubs for 
specific purposes, like Robert 
Welch's C A S E  (Committee 
Against Summit Entanglements).

Subscribe to libertarian publi­
cations like American Mercury. 
American Opinion, National Re­
view. U S News St World Re­
port, Freemen, and Human 
Events, and don't renew sub­
scriptions to publications which 
promote the socialist-labor-wo! 
fare state.

Support Patriots
Support the advertisers in the 

libertarian publications and help 
conservative commentators like 
George Sokolsky. Fulton Lewis, 
Dan Smoot. Wayne Poucher. and 
Dean Man ion remain on the air 
by your contributions or your 
purchases of the products they 
advertise.

What a man says he is, is not 
what counts. Practically every 
lawmakers says he's against 
inflation, against Socialism. A 
look at their voting records 
makes fools, cowards, liars, or 
voting booth prostitutes out of 
most of our lawmakers

Why not send all officeholders 
for whom you have a right to 
vote a list of things you're far' 
Demand that they state clearly 
how they stand on each issue 
listed Kill Civil Service, so mil­
lions of unneeded government 
workers can be fired. Insist that 
the labor union monopoly be 
ended and that unions be placed 
under the same anti-trust, anti- 
rsrketeering. taxpaying laws as 
are businesses.

Limit tht tune any congress 
man can serve to. say. 12 years 
Too many of them get so cynical, 
so important, and so stricken 
with Potomac fever that their 
main objective in life is to stay 
in Washington.

Wc have tried the little-prun- 
ing-here-and-there method. And 
the bureaucratic wilderness gets 
larger, denser, wilder every year. 
We need to dig up by the roots

For
Good Shoes

It's

FARRAR'S
in Gainesville

entire agencies, bureaus, and ac­
tivities.

This nation was founded by 
men who believed in God, in in­
dividual freedom, in high moral 
values, in personal responsibility, 
Whether we survive as free men 
or slaves depends on whether 
we can resurrect our moral 
strength. We must faar slavery 
m o r e  than we f e a r  war. 
The wages of wealth are com­
fort. complacency, caution, and 
cowardice.

Missile strength, manpower 
strength, H-bomb strength get 
the headlines. Few ever mention 
the greatest weapon: spiritual 
strength. Who—we or the Com­
munists—have the fanatical zeal 
necessary to survive? Which will 
make the moat sacrifices and thej

least compromises?
We are in a war for survival.

And we are lasing.
Lincoln said, “Our safety, our 

liberty, depend upon preserving 
the Constitution of the United 
States as our Founding Fathers 
made it, inviolate The people of 
the U 8. are the rightful masters 
of both congress and courts, not 
to overthrow the Constitution, 
but to overthrow the men who 
pervert the Contitution” loot's 
start overthrowing, now

9UAUTT MATIIIAU

The custom of mounting a 
horse from the left side probably | 
started in the days when men | 
wore long swords that hung down 

k f t  k g . . f t  w m  — M ar t> |
throw the right 
horse's back.

leg over the

W« are aquippad to handle remodeling 
from start to finish. See us before you rs* 
model. We can save you time and money.

Waples Painter Company
G odr.es v ille

C o m e in pardner--fo  our big hoedowh 
—well swing tfou the 

jk  hottest deal in tovv̂ h I #

wg'ns -mAoiu' hk>h
AMO P A IC IN O  L O W !

Galaxie C l u b  V ic t o r ia

N O P
STOP wasting money repairing 
your car and burning extra gas and 
oil as older cars do. STOP watch­
ing it go down in resale value 
before your eyes . . . missing the 
comfort, fun and safety of a new 
Ford on your vacation trip.

SWAP while huge sales let us give
tremendous trade-ins SWAP 
bt}or$ your vacation . . .  when you 
can get the roost pleasure out of a 
new car. SWAP on a car that will 
U«y in style . . . simy worth more 
. . . the world’s most beautifully 
proportioned car.

41

SAVE on first equipped cost SAVE 
up to $55 a year on gas and oil . . . 
frith an aluminized muffler that 
normally lasts up to twice as long. 
SAVE with a Diamond Lustre No- 
Wax Finish . . . with a tong-lasting. 
standard 66-plate battery. SAVE dur­
ing Ford’s SUMMER SWAPPING BEE.

r.ix r.

— —

■ - v' ' • /  ■' i  • - "
i* “ 5 '

G ET A H O N E Y  O F  A DEAL N O W  AT

Endres Motor Company
MUENSTER, TEXAS PHONE 44



Moved from M uenster to make 
their home in Albuquerque, N. 
M., are Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Cunningham and five children.

They left Sunday. He was an
employee at the local milk plant 
and they occupied the house 
north of Clarence Wilson.

THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE JULY 17, 1959 PAGE FIVE

Flowers (or 
Every Occasion

Since 1884 It's

KADEN, The Florist
Flowerpnone HOS-5221, Gainesville

Represented in Muenster by Mrs. Nick Miller

Local News
B R I E F S

Here from Louisville, Ky., to 
spend four days this week were 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Streng. They 
were guests of his mother, Mrs. 
Lena Streng.

Linda Fette is vacationing in 
Lubbock with her uncle and 
aunt, the C. W. Ratliffs. She ac­
companied Mrs. Ratliff and son 
Sammy home after their visit 
here Thursday.

Former Muensterites Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Thomasson and child­
ren Joan, Margaret, Paul and 
Joey of Hays, Kansas, spent the 
weekend here with her parents 
and family, the H. M. Schrnitzes. 
Saturday evening all the rela­
tionship was together for a picnic 
supper in City Park.

The new voice saying “Number 
Please” at Muenster Telephone 
Company belongs to Mrs. Wesley 
Landsfeld. Meanwhile two former 
voices are no longer heard. Mrs. 
Alvin Fuhrman has taken a job 
at M uenster State Bank and Mrs. 
Wilfred Luttm er has resigned on 
account of her health.

The Wesley Landsfeld family 
has moved to the former Ed 
Schmitt home on Main Street. 
The place they previously occu­
pied on North Cedar has been 
bought by Mrs. Susie Noggler 
who will move there at a later 
date. The farm the Noggler fam ­
ily has been living on has been 
sold by Mrs. J. H. Otto to Mar­
tin Bayer.

Ending a vacation visit here 
Monday was Nancy Dlabaj of 
Ennis who was the guest of 
Kathleen McGannon for five 
days. Sunday Kathleen enter­
tained with a swim party and 
picnic for Nancy. Eight girl 
friends enjoyed the event at City 
Park.

PeiwylDise
and

PoundStmt
BONUS SPECIAL!

CRYSTAL

Ice Cream
V 2  S a l-  6 9 c

Cal. Top No. 2Vi Elbert a sliced

Welchade, qt
GRAPE DRINK . . . 3 for 89c
TEA, Morton’s */4 lb. _ _ _ _ 25c

Home Grown

Tomatoes 
lb. 10c

Sunkist

Oranges
2 lb. 25c

BONUS SPECIAL!

Average a a
25 to 30 lbs. 4Vc ea,

Folger's

Instant Coffee 
6 oz. 79c

Arrow

CHARCOAL
BRIQUETS

10 lbs. 49c

U. S. Choice Heavy Aged

Banquet Beef
SEVEN ROAST . . 
PRIME RIB ROAST
SHORT R IB S ________ lb. 29c
Armour Star Spiced. 3 lb. can
LUNCHEON M E A T ____ $1.29

. lb. 45c 

. lb. 79c HAM
BONUS SPECIAL!

Armour Star 
Tender Smoked
SHANK PORTION _ lb. 35c 
BUTT PORTION . ,1b. 45c 
CENTER SLICES . .lb.79c

10c Dutch Country

Juice Glasses . .12 for $1.00
Dutch Country 19 ox.

Ice Tea Glasses .6  for $1.00

Rag. 19c, pint six#

Rubbing Alcohol .  13c
Reg. 43c size

Curad Bandages . . 29c

Sister Aloysia Kleiss and Miss 
Katie Hacker left Saturday by 
train from Dallas for Arkansas.
Sister Aloysia returned to Holy 
Angels Convent in Jonesboro af­
ter a visit with her mother, Mrs. 
Mike Kleiss, and Miss Hacker is 
spending a week in Pocahontas 
with her sister, Sister Frowina. 
Mr. and Mrs. A1 Kleiss and child­
ren took them to Dallas and saw 
them  off. Sister Florentine is 
rem aining here for an extended 
visit with her mother, Mrs. John 
Tempel.

Members of the Toastmasters 
Club at Gainesville heard Henry 
Weinzapfel as the featured speak­
er at their regular meeting the 
past week. Henry talked about 
combatting boredom and tired­
ness and suggested ways of hav­
ing a good day and enjoying 
people, so as not to feel like 
one is being cheated of sleep.

Off on a ten-day vacation are 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hoedebeck, 
accompanying Mr. and Mrs. Leo 
Hoedebeck of Gainesville. They 
visited first in Colorado with the 
Clarence Erpeldings and Alex 
Knaufs at Colorado Springs and 
saw places of tourist interest. The 
rest of the trip is sight-seeing all 
the way to San Francisco. In 
San Diego they’ll stop to visit 
the Joe Hoedebeck*. Meanwhile 
Grandpa and Grandma Fred 
Hoedebeck are baby sitting with 
Gene and Elsie’s youngsters.

Postcards arrived the past week 
from Mrs Frank Kathman, vaca­
tioning In Greggton with her 
daughter Thelma and family, the 
Pete Hawthornes.

Visiting Sunday afternoon with 
Jim  Walker and his mother. Mrs. 
Ada Walker were Rev. Jack Horn- 
er of Denison and Mr. and Mrs. 
E G. Ramsey and Mr and Mrs. 
Sterling Hobbs of Gainesville. 
Other visitors were E. E Ball­
inger, Nathan W hitt and Rev. 
and Mrs. C. M Luster.

Mr and Mrs. Lee Haverkamp 
and daughter Joyce and Mr. and 
Mrs Henry Spaeth of Gainesville 
drove to Electra Sunday where 
they were dinner and afternoon 
guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Haverkamp The 
Spaeths’ children David and 
Patsy spent the day with their 
uncle and aunt and family, the 
Ed Knaufs. here.

Mr and Mrs. Ed Schneider and 
children are back from a vacation 

J trip to Arkansas They were 
guests of his parents, M r  and 
Mrs William Schneider in Subi- 
aco and enjoyed visiting the new 
abbey church and Ed’s Alma 
Mater, Subiaco Academy. They 
also went to Fort Smith to see 
his brother and two sisters and 
their families and another sister. 
Sister Helen, who is in the con­
vent at Fort Smith. Adding more 
interest to the tn p  he Schneiders 
made a our of the Rockefeller 
Ranch near Little Rock.

A tourist’s tour of New York 
City was taken by Mrs. H. L. 
Jackson of Fort Worth when she
accompanied her husband on a 
business trip. They’re at home 
after being away ten days and 
Dora has been giving glowing re­
ports in letters to her parents, 
the J. M. Weinzapfels. While Mr. 
Jackson spent his days in busi­
ness conferences his wife spent 
the time sight-seeing. Together 
they attended evening events, 
flew to Hartford, Conn., to see his 
sister and family, then flew to 
Washington, D. C., where they 
were met by Mrs. Jackson’s sis­
ter and husband, Lt. Col. and 
Mrs. David Bright and after ft 
tour of the nation’s capital were 
taken to the Bright home in 
Alexandria, Va., for a visit.

NEWTON F STOGNER 
UPHOLSTERING SHOP

Bargains in rebuilt 
and reupholstered 

furniture

205 East Boqgess
(Next to I. Farrias Produce) 

Ph. 2520. Shop or Res. 
Saint Jo

CARD OF THANKS
Many thanks to everyone who 

remembered me during my ill­
ness. I am grateful for the 
prayers, spiritual bouquets, flow­
ers. visits, greeting cards and 
every kindness. Also thanks to 
Father Christopher and Father 
Lane for their hospital visits.

Elizabeth Koelzer

H e ra ’s the w ay to

L O W -C O S T
H O M B  C O O L IN G  I

Im perial models 
slightly higher

B E L L E V IE W /0 e 6 t
A I R  C O O L E R S

EX C LU SIV E FLOW TROLf 
G R IL L E ,  with adjustable k>u-
vert, direct* cool sir where you 

-weal I t  Jnrt a sweep of your 
tn«er — end unlimited choice is 
youral
EXCLUSIVE M ICROOLASf 
FILTER  trap* du*t and polka 
—bruit* ia only clean air.
Carat in and we the*e modem
cooler* today I y -  - - -

The More Efficient Way 
To Pump Your Water
Jensen counterbalanced pumps are similar in 

design to oil field pumps . . , can be operated on 
a  Va H. P. motor instead of the usual 1 H .P . motor. 
Can be used with a  windmill . . . have water-lubri­
cated stuffing box . . . will force water into pressure 
tank or storage tank.

C. D. Shamburger Lumber Co.
Dick Trachta, Mgr., Muenster
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IT HAPPENED 
20 YEARS AGO

July 7. 1939
City considers drilling own 

water well; estimates place cost 
of installation near $4,000 and 
operation at 4 cents a thousand 
gallons; should pay out in four 
or five years as average city bills 
range from $150 to $200 per 
month. City council votes for 
another try at street illumination. 
Rev. Frowin Koerdt ended 21 
years as Muenster pastor on July 
6. With bad weather gone, thres­
hers are nearing the end of a 
record crop. REA Co-op favors 
extension in Spanish Fort area 
as Callisburg loses interest. Ray 
Heilman replaces Herbert Meurer 
as city secretary. Gilbert Endres 
is visiting here after completing

Before you Buy 
Check Our 
Prices on

G U L F

T I R E S
and

B A T T E R I E S

Ford's
Gulf Station

Muenster

a course in diesel engineering in 
Los Angeles, Calif, and will go 
from here to Centralia, 111., to be 
employed.

July 14. 1939
Thermometers soar to 110 de­

grees to hit season’s high mark. 
Local Volunteer Firemen elect 
Henry Luke fire chief. Andrew 
and Anna Fleitman escape in­
jury when their car turns over. 
Paul and Ed Walterscheid resume 
management of Rock Station. At 
Fleitman has his tonsils removed. 
Mrs. Ben Luke is recovering 
from major surgery. Mrs. Ben 
Sicking attends shortcourse at 
A&M College. Muenster and 
Lindsay delegates attend 41st an­
nual convention of Catholic State 
League at Olfen. Muenster’s hope 
for legal beer is blasted by 
O’Daniel’s vote. Best well of Voth 
pool comes in; three offsets due 
to follow.

15 YEARS AGO
July 7, 1944

Seventy-eight Muenster per­
sons donate blood to plasma 
unit for Red Cross. City plans 
street and park improvement as 
community projects. The Alf 
Schumachers will re-open Main 
Hotel in Wolf building as soon as 
remodeling is completed. Mrs

AN EXTRA SERVICE 
at no extra cost
You can see and 
feel the difference

StaNu
Homogenizes vital 

textile oil back into 
the fabric
We Give 

S&H Green Stamps

MILLER'S
Cleaners & Hatters

Gainesville

Healthful Living
in cool, clean, dry, filtered crir

N E W
M. 4.1 I RIOO J 
ITU R«M»s — 11,000

® U H u n £ p o o 6
I M P E R I A L  A I R  C O N D I T I O N E R

Q S 3

Not a Deluxe. Not a Custom. But a 1 HJ>. 11.000 BTU

IMPERIAL _ _ _ .only$199.95
Pay only $8.55 per month

Separate Humidity Control lets you practically 
"make your own weather.” It’s the moat com­
plete climate control you’ve ever had!

Thermostatic Temperature Control keepe your 
rooms at ths temperature you select. Enjoy 
a draft-free, healthful, comfortabla home.

Permanent Aluminum Filter that alipa out for 
easy cleaning . . .  slides back in a jiffy to trap 
dust, smoke and pollen.

High Fashion" Picture Panel that makes this
RCA WHIRLPOOL a wonderful p art of your 
room decor. Six panel designs to  choose from 
. . .  change them  in seconds for new effects!

3 fan tpeedt • weather-sealed cabinet 
• full cooling, air exhausting and dehu- 
midifying operation

HOwnd 5-4326

GAINESVILLE,TEXAS

•  Housewares
•  Appliances
• Giftware
•  Farm Machinery
•  International T rucks

M. J. Endres is recovering from 
poison oak infection. Formal 
dedication of Denison Dam is 
held Ju ly  1. Twenty-seven local 
women receive awards for volun­
teer USO work at Gainesville 
club. Stockholders of Relax 
Theatre elect Dr. T. S. Myrick as 
president. Mrs. Joe Voth is re ­
covering from an emergency ap­
pendicitis operation. Lightning 
during a brief thunder shower 
does minor damage at Victor 
Hartman farm home. Pvt. Henry 
Luttm er writes about visit in 
Rome. S.Sgt. Ferd Yosten sends 
flag of the Rising Sun home after 
it was taken from the enemy 
in battle.

July 14. 1944
Joe Burkhart, 76, dies after 

long illness. Sister Angeline, 71, 
former local teacher, dies in 
Jonesboro. Muenster meets war 
bond quota on last day of drive, 
total figure is $96,580 25. Clarence 
Wilson’s mother dies at age of 
82. County service men’s honor 
roll is dedicated at Gainesville; 
carries names of more than 3000 
men and women. Sunday was 
hottest day here with the m er­
cury standing at 103 degrees. Pas­
tor Father Thomas Buergler is 
on a two-week vacation in Ark­
ansas. Pvt. Otto Walterscheid is 
recovering from a broken leg 
sustained in New Guinea. Arnold 
Rohmer. David Lehnert*. Bill 
Hess and Tony Hacker leave for 
duty in the army.

10 YEARS AGO
July §. 1949

School board has seven teach­
ers and will add two more. 
Church fund gets $8,500 boost1 
from July 3-4 benefit. Telephone 
Company completes recovery 
from winter damage J W Fisher 
is named district deputy of KC 
Sixth District Billy Ray Heilman 
breaks right arm Scoutmaster 
Nick Miller, 17 Scouts, Alvin 
Hartman. Curley Pels and Shorty 
Reeves return from trip to Carls­
bad Caverns and Big Bend Na­
tional Park. Juanita Weinzapfel 
has gone to Illinois to study 
music at the Chicago Conserva­
tory of Music The Virgil Hell- 
mans and family of Los Angeles 
are vacationing here PFC Eddie 
Fleitman is on leave from Scott 
Field. 111. and PFC Kenneth 
Wiesman is here from Hamilton 
Field, Calif

* July IS. 1949 
City council urges water con­

servation during emergency Ex­
tended illness of Ray Berner is J 
ended by death. City'a little fire j 
fighter does snappy job on tank J  
truck blaze Ralph Esker is re­
covering from illness resulting 
from heat exhaustion Miss Clara 
Trachta left Thursday to return 
to Los Angeles after visiting rela­

tives here. Johnann Seyler re ­
turns to job at Sey ltr Motor Com­
pany after spending four weeks 
at Eagle Mountain Lake as coun- 
cellor at Girl Scout camp. Rose 
Gieb of Lindsay is married to 
C. B. Fallon in Sherman. PFC 
Norbert Mages is transferred 
from Eglin ABF, Florida, to Cha- 
nute AFB, Illinois. New arrivals: 
boys for the Tony Hoenigs, Law­
rence Vogels and Raymond 
Lauxes.

5 YEARS AGO
July 9. 1954

Mrs. John Hoberer, 73, a resi­
dent of Lindsay 57 years, dies 
after several weeks of illness. R. 
B Hollandworth, 60, oil operator 
in this area dies of heart attack 
at his home in Dallas. Post Office 
will be closing at noon on Satur­
days beginning Ju ly  17. City wa­
ter use reaches new high with 
242,000 gallons in one day, but 
there is plenty of water left. Of­
ficial count of city population is 
listed as 1093. Construction on 
first flood control dam starts on 
Elm Watershed at Alex Lutken- 
haus place. Mrs. Gene Hoedebeck 
has major surgery at Gainesville. 
Johnny Schmitz is back with a 
discharge from the army after 
serving in Korea Marriages: Ola 
King and Louis Roberg, Doris 
Reiter and Cpl Henry Grewing, 
J o y c e  Grewing and Alrich 
Zwinggi. New arrivals: Boys for 
the Richard Growings and Leon­
ard Bengforts; a girl for the 
George Schmidlkofers.

July 16. 1954
Henry J. Weinzapfel. 87. pio­

neer resident of Windthorst, 
dies after long illness. 37 inch 
shower brings welcome relief in 
record heat wave. 200 young 
people assemble here in first 
meeting of deanery CYC. City 
tops former water use record us­
ing a total of 320.000 gallons in 
one day. Rev Ed Pettijohn 
comes here as full-time pastor of 
Baptist Church. Joe Hermes of 
Lindsay and Nancy Ann Bashara 
marry in Austin. Mrs R R 
Endres haa gone to New M«-x to 
be with her daughter, Mrs Frank 
Hcnnigan. who has had an opera­

tion. Elmer Fette is attending 
firemen’s training school at A&M 
College this week. Engagement 
of Ri th Fisher and Max Rum-

m elhart is told. Mr. and Mrs. 
Alvin Rauschuber of Valley View 
announce arrival of twin daugh­
ters.

L I V E l M O D E
~ 7/lfbrd.o njxAlnjLWITH

E V A P O R A T I V E  C O O L E R
LOW INITIAL COST!
LOW OPERATING COST!
LOW MAINTENANCE COST!
RUGGED BUT 
ELEGANT

CONSTRUCTED OS HEAVY GAUGE 
METAl WITH A HANDSOME FINISH

*  Easy Turn 360° louvers
★  Heavy Asphalt Undercoated 

Interior
it  5 Position Volume Control

★ CACCTV A i AflTr SWITCH>Art I T v g r o u n d in g  ukminai

C. D. Shamburger Lumber Co.
Dick Trachta. Mgr. Muenster

BUDGET PERMANENTS 
AND HAIR COLORING 

M ondays O nly

SPECIAL PRICES ON 
PERMANENT WAVES 

Tuas.. W ed.. Thur».

Marylin Miller Cosmetics
ALLEN 8 BEAUTY SHOP

Mrs J. M. Allen 
Mary Alice Wisdom 

106 E Elm. H05-4111 
Gainesville

LOOKING FOR THE 
*64,000 ANSWER TO COOL O  

DRIVING Z

I T ' S  P U S H - B U T T O N

F r iq iT fe n q
‘ orth ixciusivt

CAR "f?"rroucM
A I D  t«0 tuioMtnt 
M i l t  nio»>< cum* -

C O N D IT IO N ER
E A S I L Y  I N S T A L L E D  I N  
Y O U R  P R E S E N T  C A R

Up a tteep mud-choked uxuh—Po$itraction payt offl

NO MOUNTAIN GAT, M ISTER...

Through a mountain itream—deep in Avintaquin Canyon.

That’s a Chevy with Positraction!
That 3134 Fleetside has the sure­
footed ways of a big western bob­
cat. Roams through high brush 
country that would buck the life 
out of most trucks. Crosses 
stream s without benefit  of a 
bridge.  Climbs ta lus  grades 
where pinon won’t even grow. But 
that’s all routine for this Chevy, 
equipped with Positraction* rear 
axle. It’s hard at it every day for 
the Utah Fish and Game com­
mission. Figure about 60,000 
miles of mountaineering before 
this Chevy is traded. And yet the

district  officer who drives it 
would bet his badge the tie rods 
won’t even need replacing!

Out in that wild, climbing Utah 
country, Chevy’s suspension and 
frame and brakes, its Positrac­
tion rear axle and Thriftmaster 
6 power are proving themselves 
under rougher conditions than 
most test engineers could dream 
up. They’re proving that Chev­
rolet’s advanced engineering and 
design ideas pay off—in Bpades— 
when the going gets especially 
mean and dirty.

Positraction, of course, is a 
big plus on this job, providing 
the  sure  gr ip needed to dig 
through mud, snow, loose sand, 
whatever comes along. Could be 
that a Positraction-equipped Va* 
ton pickup is the answer for your 
area of operation. Or maybe a 
4-wheel drive Chevy. We’ve got 
trucks that specialize in getting 
in and out of any kind of coun­
try. Talk to your dealer about 
your needs. He’ll show you what 
tough trucks are made of.

*Optional at extra eoet

No job’s too tough for a  Chevrolet truck!

See your local authorized Chevrolet dealer!

J. B. Wilde, Chevrolet Dealer
304 N. Main St. Muenster, Texas Phone 61

i*

J

Jk

»•

* I

J



THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE JULY 17. 1959 PAGE SEVEN

WANTED: dependable lady to 
live in home, care for children 
and do light housework 5 days 
a week. Good pay, private room. 
Mrs. Rufus Bezner; H05-2673, 
Box 72 Lindsay. 34-tf

FARM AUCTION at Ed Sturm 
Farm, 3 mi. south, 1 mi. east of 
Pilot Point. 20 or more tractors, 
combines, balers, mowers, rakes, 
plows, one-ways all sizes. 34-2p

SPECIAL NOTICE 
Our cleaning and pressing and 

shoe repairing business will be 
closed from July  27 to August 
10. Nick Miller. 34-3

FOR SALE: Turkeys, all sizes, 
take your pick at a dollar each. 
Contact Lucille Welch on H. D. 
Field Ranch, Saint Jo, Texas.

33-2p

FOR YOUR FARM NEEDS

Gasoline, Oil, Supplies, etc.
Call Gulf Oil Corporation

Jimmy Lehnertz. Dist.
Pk. HOS-4562 — HOS 5420

Gainesville
Or see your local dealer 
Ferd Luttmer, Muenster

LEGAL NOTICE
Cooke County Precinct 3 will 

accept bids at the Commissioners 
Court until 9 a.m. July 30 for 
purchase of one 1959 truck of 
following specifications. 2 ton 
capacity, V-8 engine, 292 cu. in. 
displacement or equivalent, 130 
in. wheelbase, single speed axle, 
heavy duty rear springs. 2 7.50 
x 20 8-ply nylon front and 4 8.25 
x 20 10-ply nylon mud grip rear 
tires and tubes, turn indicators, 
electric windshield wipers. Less 
trade-in of 1950 Dodge 3-ton 
t'uck . Price to include changing 
dump bed from 1955 Ford to new 
truck, with necessary lights, re­
flectors. single speed power take­
off and state inspection stick­
er. Truck to be delivered to 
Commissioner of Precinct 3, 
Cooke County.

SUMMER SPECIALS. Bring a 
friend. *15 cold wave, 2 for $15. 
Reg. $12.50 wave, $6.25 ea. $8 50 
wave, $5.00. Hair shaping, sham­
poo and set, $2.00 Wet set, 75c. 
Rhoda Ann Beauty Shop. 319 N. 
Red River, Gainesville. HG5- 
9712. Free Parking. 31-4

BONDED, LICENSED 
REAL ESTATE BROKER 

Henry G Weinzapfel 
Office: Muenster State Bank 

Prepared to accept listings for 
ssle or purchase of real estate, 
rental and escrow accounts. 22tf

FAMOUS

Falcon Dinettes
Be sure to see these if you are thinking about a  

new  dinette. A really nice assortment of 5. 7 and 9 
piece suites with tables of 36 and 42 inches widths 
Bronze or chrome framework, Formica tops and up­
holstered chairs in a  good selection of shades and 
patterns.

SCOTT BROS.
Muenster

The dry cow is one of the important animals on 
a dairy farm. She represents your future milk 
check. Yet, just think of all the dairy cow has to 
do in a 60-day period. It is the only time of the 
year that the cow can build up body reserves and 
get set for the next lactation period, but she also 
has to build the final two-thirds of the calf she is 
producing. That is quite a job and it calls for 
plenty of good nutrition.

Insure that you provide your dairy cow with 
the help she needs to perform her job properly. 
Our fortified d ty and freshening ration is formu­
lated to provide the critical balance of vitamins, 
minerals and other essential nutrients your cow 
requires for proper nourishment during this calf­
building, body-building time.

Come in today and let us fully explain to you 
the many advantages you obtain when you feed

Muenster Milling Company
F E E D  -  SEED  -  GRAIN  -  F E R T I L I Z E R  
Vium* 9 7  M u£ H S T £ P  , TEXAS

Ford Dealer 
A-l Used Car 

Shopping Center
1957 Ford Custom 300, V-8, 

4-door, Fordomatic, radio, heater, 
white tires.

1956 Ford Fairlane V-8. 4-door, 
Fordomatic, radio, heater, year 
round air conditioning, low mile­
age, local owned.

1957 Ford Custom 300, V-8, 4- 
door, radio, heater.

1955 Chevrolet 4 door, 6-cyl., 
standard transmission, r a d i o ,  
heater. An economical car.

Used Pickups
1956 Ford Vi ton. V-8. auto­

matic transmission, radio, heater.
1955 Ford Vt ton. V-8, auto­

matic transmission, radio, heater, 
heavy duty wheels and tires, 
locally owned, A-l condition 
throughout.

1956 Chevrolet pickup. 118 in. 
wheelbase, good tires. A good 
buy.

Endres Motor Co.
Muenster 34-1

CUSTOM SPRAYING 
Anything. Hnvwhere 

MUENSTER HATCHERY, Ph 63
32tf

STARTED PULLETS 10 to 20 
weeks old. California Whites, 
White Leghorns or Ames in 
Cross.
MUENSTER HATCHERY, Ph 63

32 tf

Dirt Work of All Kinds
See us for tanks, terraces and 

any kind of dirt work. We have 
the right equipment to give you 

i a good job and a good deal on 
| any kind of earth moving.

GILBERT ENDRES 4Stf
Monuments 

and Grave Markers
See Tony Otto 17tf
S P E C I A L

Used Maytag automatic wash- 
era, completely overhauled. 3 
months guarantee. $99 50 a n d  
old washer.

Albert Plumbing & Heating 
209 E Calif , Gainesville 17t2

WINDOW SHADES, "w ith or 
without rollers, plastic or Clopsy 
Washable, cut to your size.

VARIETY STORE 31 tf
LIGHT FIXTURES for any 

room of the house In stock at 
Community Lumber Co. 40tf

Chain Link Fence Installed
Let us figure your fencing needs 
C. D. Shamburger Lumber Co.

ltf
TANKS TOR SALE. Septic 

tanks, stock tanks, grain tanks, 
water tanks. Will Install. Bayer 
Bros. Ph. 225-J-2. Muenster. fltf

VENETIAN BLINDS
Repaired. Retaplng and re-cord­
ing. Tony Hoenig. Phone 63-W-l, 
Muenster 50tf

HAND SAWS FILED 
AND RE-TOOTHED 

Guaranteed precision w o r k  
with Foley automatic machines. 
See Matt Schmitz. Muenster.

6 26p

HOUSE FOR RENT 1 mile 
northeast of town. See Bruno 
Fleitman. 29tf

ELECTRIC MOTORS 
In sizes ranging from V* HP 

to 2 HP. Motor pulleys, popular 
sizes in stock, others available in 
a hurry.

Community Lumber Co. 16tf
HAND TOOLS. Big assort­

m ent of guaranteed s o c k e t  
wrenches, end wrenches, box 
wrenches, pliers, cutters, screw­
drivers, e t c., at Community 
Lumber Co. 40tf

UNITED BEDDING CO.
Renovate your old cotton m at­
tress into a new lnnerspring or 
cotton mattress. Box springs to 
match or bed springs. Work 
guaranteed. All mattresses m a­
chine made. 1-day service. Save 
up to 50%. Ph. H05-3882. 324 
N. Commerce, Gainesville. 3tf
WATCH Sc JEWELRY REPAIR 

All cleaning done by electro- 
sonic machine and t i m i n g  
checked by Watchmaster. 

BROWNING'S JEWELRY
Gainesville l l t f

COOLER SUPPLIES 
W ater pumps, pads, plastic and 

copper pipe, valves, etc . . . and 
coolers.
C. D. Shamburger Lumber Co.

26tf
KILL ROACHES, flies, mos­

quitoes and silverfish overnight 
with the Mighty Light. Hofbau- 
er*t. 28 8

BALER WIRE — TWINE 
for all makes of balars

TONY’S SEED STORE 29tf

MAKE DAIRYING PAY the 
COBA way. Breed your cows to 
outstanding proven sires from 
Central Ohio Breeding Assn. 
Jerry  Hoenig, local technician. 
For service call 241-R-4 or 87. 
Sundays call operator before 10.

29tf.

BICYCLE PARTS 
AND REPAIRS 

Hennigan Motor Co. 15tf
F E N C E

Chain link fence. Gateway 
Fence Co. HOS-4715, L. R. Bis­
hop. 1012 N. Grand Ave. Gaines­
ville. 49-5p-tf

NECCHI-ELNA 
SEWING MACHINES 

Sales . . . Service . . . Rentals 
Also service on other makes 

of sewing machines. New Necchi 
machines for rent. Custom made 
buttons, button holes, buckles, 
belts.

Necchi-Elna Sewing Circle 
H05-2542, 320 E. Calif.

Gainesville

SCRATCH-ME NOT 
WITH ITCH-ME-NOT

A p p ly  ITCH X T  HOT l a  U  m ln a lM . 
If tb* Itch n M d i K f t l c k l i i f .  y e a r  
♦Sc back . Y on faa l lh a  m ed ica tio n  taka  
b o ld  lo  n u ll lh a  kick la  m lnu tas:  
w atch  h ea lth y , c le a r  akin com a o a . 
Oat IT C H -M E -N O T  from  a n y  d r a w l i t  
lo r  a a ta m a l akin Irr ita tion s. HOW at 
D ix la  D ra y  S tore .

ICE CUSTOMERS 
'  NOTICE!

Our ice house is now open 
Sundays until noon.

Ferd’s Gulf Station 24tf.
Don't let JUNK IRON clutter 

up your place. Bring it in and 
sell it to J. P. FLUSCHE. 9tf

SINGER
Sewing Machine Co.

SALES AND SERVICE 
Mail a card to 311 E. Californ­

ia, Gainesville, or p h o n e  
HOS-5032. Or leave word at 
Ferd’s Gulf Station, Muenster.

FOR SALE: House in city, 
I present John P. Streng home. 
For Sale: 202 acre farm, south of 
town. Nick Schenk owner. Con­
tact Henry Weinzapfel at Muen­
ster State Bank. 24-tf.

$

Dependable low cost transportation in several 
good and clean old models that will still give 
thousands of miles of service.

Come and see these. You can't find better buys 
for an extra car, or a  fishing car.

1951 Ford club coupe
1949 Chevrolet 2-door
1950 Ford 2-door
1951 Plymouth club coupe
2 1950 Dodge 4-doors

TUGGLE MOTOR CO.
Muenster, Texas

. , .v

MOTORS All sizes for air con­
ditioners, m ilking machines, wa­
ter pumps, oil field equipment, 
etc. C. D. Sham burger Lumber 
Co. 29 tf

GLASS
Plate, window, automobile, fur­
niture tops, mirrors. Old mirrors 
resilvered. For complete glass 
service call Gainesville Glass 
Shop. H05-3321, 311 N. Chestnut.

Monuments For Sale
Beautiful memorials in granite 

and marble. All types of grave 
markers in all colors. Nick Miller, 
Muenster.

HOUSE FOR SALE. 5 rooms, 
basement, garage. On North 
Main near church and school. 
Mrs. Mary Voth. 24tf

SHOE REPAIRING 
We do fine repair and dye 

work on all types of shoes, also 
saddle work. Jack Cheaney’s 
Saddle & Shoe Shop, Across 
from bus station, Gainesville. 17tf

CARBORUNDUM g r i n d i n g  
wheels, all sizes, and sickle 
grinders. Community Lumber 
Co. 25tf

NEW AND USED 
CARS AND PICKUPS 

Good selection of makes and 
models. Try us before you buy.

KUBIS AND SONS 
H05-9711, Gainesville 16tf

PIPE, Big, medium sized or 
small, new and used. Also suck­
er rods.

J. P. FLUSCHE 9-tf
It Pays to Check Our Pricei

. . . on car, truck or tractor tires 
and batteries and accessories. 

FERD'S GULF STATION
OATS AND HAY 

FOR SALE
Felderhoff Bros., Rt. 1, Muens­
ter. Ph. 201-W-3 or Myra 2321.

TABLE LEGS 
All sizes, 6 in. to 28 in.

Metal or Wood 
Community Lumber Co. 16tf

CONCRETE WORK 
We’ll do any kind of a concrete 
job or furnish ready mix con­
crete for your Job.

Bayer Brothers 28 tf
SAVE MONEY. Let Pearson 

Huneycutt do your watch and 
clock repair work. 406 N. Grand, 
Gainesville. 49tf

Mr. and Mrs J. A. Sanders 
drove to Fort Worth Saturday 
to spend the day with their 
children and grandchildren.

You Can't 
Look Your Best

Unless
Your Clothes 

Look Their Best

LONE STAR 
CLEANERS

HATTERS
I. P. GOSLIN, Prop.

Ph- HOS-2151, Gainesville

Sunday visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Linn were Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Johnson, friends f r o m
Gainesville.

Ica Cream Milk Shakes 
Sandwiches

at Drive-In Window of

ACE CAFE

LtVI'5
DOUBLE-KNft
WESTERN JEANS

H A M R I C ' S
The place to go for brands 

you know.

COMPLETE

FUNERAL

SERVICE

Miller
Funeral Home

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTING

Fixtures
Supplies

Appliances
Residential. Commercial 

and Oil Reid Wiring 
Installations. Repairs 

Appliance Repairs

Call H05-2721
Nights call

H05-3263 or HOS 2M4

Parker Electric
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville

More Stockers
We'll have another nice herd of them for our 

sale Saturday . . .  40 cow and calf pairs, mostly 
An gun, in fine condition . . .  good buys as herd 
builders.

. . .  and an Extra Good Market
Good butcher cattle are selling especially high 

lately, and we're expecting the prices to hold 
through our next sale.

Muenster Livestock Auction
Dick Cain, Owner and Auctioneer
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Lindsay News
Telling about a pleasant trip 

are Cecilia Neu and her mother, 
Mrs. Joe Neu, who visited rela­
tives in Omaha, Neb., and came 
back sight-seeing through the 
Ozarks. They made the trip with 
friends, Bernice Wallace and son 
Rickey of Gainesville and A ir­
m an Dan Stange of Perrin AFB.

Nr*
Beauty Is Not a  Gift 

. . .It's a  Habit."

^ b O S u M u fr 'l

FASHIONETTE 
BEAUTY SALON 

303 S. Chestnut, HO5-9402 
Gainesville

RELAX
T H E A T R E

Friday • Saturday
GARY COOPER 
MARIA SCHELL

"The
Hanging Tree"

In Technicolor

Sun. • Mon. • Tu m .

ANDREY HEPBURN 
ANTHONY PERKINS 

LEE I. COBB

'Green Mansions'
In ClnemaScope 
and Metrocolor

W ednesday - Thursday
REX HARRISON 
KAY KENDALL 
SANDRA DEE 
JOHN SAXON

"The Reluctant 
Debutante"
In ClnemaScope
and Metrocolor

THE MUENSTER
In addition to visiting cousins, 
the Lloyd Robinsons, Mrs. Neu 
and Cecilia also saw a cousin, 
Father Behrens of Iowa who was 
in Omaha. And Cecilia looked up 
a pen pal she’s had for six years 
and met for the first time.

Robert Davidson returned to 
his home in Macon, Ga., Wednes­
day after a ten-day visit with 
his daughter, Mrs. Bill Eberhart 
end children. He accompanied 
the family home after their visit 
in Macon.

Sister Christina and her travel­
ing companion Sister Marcella 
were guests of relatives over the 
weekend returning to Our Lady 
of the Lake Convent in San 
Antonio Monday. The trip was 
especially to see Sister Christina’s 
sister, Mrs. John Bezner, who 
has been ill. Sister Marcella vis­
ited members of the Hermes 
families and Sister Christina also 
visited another sister, Mrs. H. J. 
Fuhrman at Muenster. Saturday 
at noon Mr. and Mrs. William 
Bezner were dinner hosts for 
Sister Christina, Mrs. John Bez­
ner, Mr. and Mrs. Otto Flusche 
of Gainesville and Mr. and Msr. 
Carl Gimple of Valley View.

Mr. and Mrs Henry Hess en­
tertained with a chicken fry at 
their home Sunday evening. 
Among guests were Mr, and Mrs 
Lee Haverkamp and daughter 
Joyce, Mr. and Mrs. Arnie Hess 
and Mr. and Mrs. Joe H. Walter- 
scheid of Muenster and Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Evans of Pilot Point.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Block and 
daughter Patty went to Perry, 
Okla., for a weekend visit with 
their daughter and sister Elfrieda 
and her husband, the Leo Wag­
ners and attended the couple's 
wedding dance given there for 
their relatives and friends

Lindsay Parent-Teacher Club 
had a call meeting Monday to 
make plans for a benefit picnic 
they will sponsor next month. 
The group set Sunday. Aug. 23. 
as the date and lined up com­
mittees to take charge of various 
details.

Lindsay Accordion 
Class in Recital

Seven young Lindsay musicians 
were presented in an accordion 
recital Sunday by their instruc­
tor. John E Lawhon at Denton.

Taking part in the program 
were Carolyn Block. Jane Stof- 
fek, Joanie Zimmerer. Patsy 
Zimmcrer. Arnold Zimmerer, 
Ronald Zimmerer and Rudy 

I Zimmerer. The eighth member 
of the class, Patty Block, was va­
cationing out of state and missed 
the musicale.

Parents attending were Nick 
] Block, Mr. and Mrs Pete Stoffela, 
Mrs Bruno Zimmerer. Mrs. 
Henry Zimmerer, Mr and Mrs. 
Norbert Zimmerer, and Mr and 
Mrs Vincent Zimmerer

ENTERPRISE

s &
Almost *13,000  
In Earnings . . .

have just been added to the accounts 
of about 650 depositors in our savings 
department.

We hope you're one of the happy savers now 
sharing in the largest semi-annual dividend in our 
history. If you are, your earnings for the first 6 
months of 1959 have already been credited to your 
account.

If you are not in this group, right now is a  good 
time to join it . . .  to let your money earn lor you.

MUENSTER STATE BANK
In our 36th year of service to Muenster

Member FDIC

—

Officers Installed 
At X of C Meeting

Installation of officers for the 
Lindsay-Gainesville Knights of 
Columbus Council featured the 
organization’s meeting Tuesday 
night.

The new officers are Grand 
Knight Joe Bezner, Deputy 
Grand Knight Lee Wolf, Treas­
urer Leo Schmitz, Chancellor Ben 
Otto, Recorder Don Owen, Advo­
cate Bob Thorne, Warden Leroy 
Kupper, Inside Guard Ed Wies­
mann, Outside Guard A. J. Fel- 
derheff, Trustees Paul Wiese, 
Nick Block and James Bezner,

Paul Wiese received state-wide 
recognition recently when he was 
named deputy of district 47. The 
district is newly organized and 
is being represented the latter 
part of this week in a state KC

Sanders Jewelry
112 N. Commerce, Gainesville

Making a pop call at the En­
terprise office Wednesday morn­
ing were Oscar Gray of Bowie 
and his son Paul Gray of Peters­
burg. They brought regards from 
Mr. Gray’s daughter and hus­
band, the Gene Carters of Sey­
mour, formerly of Muester. And 
reported that Gene is recovering 
from surgery performed at Wich­
ita General Hospital in Wichita 
Falls. He was expecting to be 
dismissed Thursday. The Carters’ 
daughter Peggy and her Air 
Force husband had spent the 
weekend in Wichita Falls where 
Mrs. Carter stayed to be near 
her husband while he was hos­
pitalized. Mr. Gray and his son 
were enroute to Oklahoma on a 
business trip.

meeting in Corpus Christi. The 
Wiese family is attending the 
state session.

CHARCOAL BROILED 
S T E A K S  

CHICKEN SEA FOOD 
MEXICAN FOOD

ACE CAFE

DR. A. A. DAVENPORT
CHIROPRACTOR 

X-RAY FLUOROSCOPE 
301 E. Broadway, Gainesville

*  Every A-l Used Car is inspected. recomliUoned if neces­
sary, and road tested And they’re warranted in writing 
by the exclusive new Performance Protection Policy’ See 
cars with the A -l (ticker at your Ford Dealer’s Used Car 
Shopping Center.

• E H  P A O E  7 F O R  F O R D  D E A L E R

^ U jsed  c a r s
INSPECTED •  R(CONDITIONED • ROAD-TESTED •  WARRANTED

New Fall Materials 
Are Here

DRESS LENGTHS in miracle 
blends of arael • dacron - 
cupioni • orlon - nylon and silk 
with cotton. 45 in. wide. 4 yard 
lengths. No two patterns alike. 
$3.89.

SKIRT LENGTHS. Blends of 
orlon. nylon, dacron, viscose 
and acetate. 60 in. wide. No 
duplicate patterns. $1.98

School Uniform Materials
SKIRT MATERIALS: Navy blue in popular modem  

resistant frabrics. all 45 in. wide.
Light weight Proxy of rayon and acrilan 

$1.89 per yd.
Medium weight blend of rayon and acetate 

$1.59 per yd.
BLOUSE MATERIALS: White wash and wear 

fabrics In three grades, all 36 Inches wide.
Drip dry Broadcloth ________ _________ yd. 59c
Pampered co tton____________   yd. 79c
Springmakf b roadc lo th__  */d. 89c
BOYS' SHIRT MATERIALS in blue wash and wear 
fabrics. 36 inches wide.
Drip dry Broadcloth yd. 59c
Pampered cotton , .......... yd. 79c

V a r ie t y  S to r e
Muenster's Ben Franklin Store

GIANT SALE
• f  W H I T E  S W A
FINER FOODS!

White Swan No. 303 
White or Golden C S 

or Golden Whole Kernel

CORN
2 for 39c

White Swan, No. 303

FRUIT
COCKTAIL
2 for 49c

White Swan. No. Vi 
Solid Pack

TUNA
2 for 59c

White Swan, 16 ox. 
Refrigerator lar

MUSTARD
2 for 31c

White Swan. No. 300

Pork and Beans . . 3 for 33c
No. 300 Con

Ranch Style Beans . . 2 for 25c
White Swan. 46 ox.

Pineapple Juice .  . . 2 for 69c
White Swan, 8 ox.

Tomato Sauce .
White Swan, No. 303

Luncheon Peas :
White Swan. 24 ox.

.  . 4 for 49c 

_ 5 for $1.00

Grape Juice . . .  .2  for 69c
White Swan, white

Pickling Vinegar .  .  . qt. 19c
White Swan, 6 ox.

Instant Coffee _ ______ 79c

White Swan, No. 303

KRAUT
2 for 27c

White Swan 14 ox.

CATSUP
2 for 35c

White Swan, 8 ox.

BISCUITS
3 for 25c

White Swan, No. 303

SPINACH
2 for 29c

Fisher's Market & Grocery
Muenster, Texas


