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The kids made the most of the snow while it was here. Emma and Caleigh Wood pose with their 
accomplishment. There were several snowmen around town but Emma said ours was a "snowgirl". 
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Muenster Police Chief nabs 
armed robbery suspect 

By Janet Felderhoff 
Muenster Police Chief 

Bob Stovall heard a 
Gainesville Police 
Department broadcast 
about an armed robbery on 
Tuesday, Feb. 10 and 
-suspected the wrong doer's 
identity. A white male 
carrying a gun had 
reportedly robbed Faiza's 
'One Stop in Gainesville. He 
made his get away in a 
yellow Volkswagen car. 

It was about 8:45 when 
Chief Stovall heard the 
information on the police 
radio. He knew of a yellow 
Volkswagen in Muenster 
and drove to the owner's 
home to check it out. Stovall 
said that the car wasn't 
there so he staked out the  

place. He also alerted the 
Gainesville Police 
Department. 

The suspect was Tony 
Howard. His girlfriend is a 
Muenster resident who 
owns a yellow Volkswagen. 
He was also identified by a 
member of the Gainesville 
Police Department from a 
video surveillance tape of 
the robbery. 

Stovall waited and 
watched the Muenster 
residence. At about 10:45 
p.m. Howard showed up in a 
different vehicle. He 
detained Howard until the 
Gainesville police showed 
up and arrested him for 
aggravated robbery. 
Howard was booked into the 
Cooke County Jail. It was  

determined that Howard 
had taken the yellow vehicle 
to Oklahoma and 
abandoned it. It was found 
in Love County. 

"There is no information 
indicating that the owner of 
the Volkswagen was 
involved in the robbery," 
remarked the Muenster 
Police Chief. The vehicle 
was taken without t her 
permission, he said. 

Good News 
"Amen, I say to you, 
whoever does not accept 
the kingdom ofGodriie 
a clitawarnot enter ft- 
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Three candidates contend for Cooke County DA position 
By Janet Felderhoff 

Cooke County's current 
district attorney Janelle 
Haverkamp hopes to be 
elected district judge of 
Cooke County. There are 
three Republican candidates 
who hope to fill the position 
she is vacating. 

Seeking the Republican 
nomination for district 
attorney are Nancy 
Manning, Cindy Stormer, 
and Roger White. All are 
currently practicing law in 
Cooke County. There are no 
Democratic candidates for 

'the office . 

Nancy Manning 
Manning, age 38, is a 

prosecutor in the Cooke 
County Attorney's office. 
She lists her education as 
A.A.S. Criminal Justice, 
B.S. Government; Texas 
Woman's University where 
she graduated Summa Cum 
Laude, and Doctor of 
Jurisprudence from Texas 
Tech University School of 
Law. 

Cindy Stormer, age 47, is 

By Janet Felderhoff 
Cooke County 

Commissioners Court 
authorized Burns, Fletcher, 
Gill architects to proceed 
with schematics and design 
phase of an EMS building 
adjacent to the new jail 
facility. That is the firm 
currently designing a new 
county jail. Commissioners 
hope to have both on the 
ballot for a bond election in 
May. 

Cooke County Judge Bill 
Freeman noted that the 
EMS provides a service to 
the County by responding to 
medical assistance calls at 
the jail. This works well 
because the EMS building is 
located next to the jail. 

"Where the EMS is 
situated now, because of the 

• railroad tracks, the 
response time is not as fast 
it could be if the EMS 
facility were located in a 
place where it could get 
across that railroad track 
and go east, preferably 
Highway 82," said 'Judge 
Freeman. (The problem is 
when a train is blocking the  

an attorney in private 
practice, handling criminal 
cases for 17 years. She 
indicated that she received 
her J.D. at South Texas 
College of Law, which wins 
more trial competitions 
than any other law school in 
the United States. Her 
honors there included Top 
Score in Criminal Trial 
Advocacy and Dean's List. 
She earned a B.A. from 
University of Texas at 
Arlington where she 
graduated with honors. Her 
A.A. was earned from 
Tarrant County Junior 
College in Fort Worth where 
she achieved Graduate with 
Highest Honors and Dean's 
List. 

Roger White, age 45, is an 
attorney ate law in private 
practice focusing on 
criminal law. He earned his 
Bachelor of Applied Arts 
and Sciences from 
Midwestern State 
University in Wichita Falls. 
He graduated Summa Cum 
Laude with a 4.0 grade 
point average (GPA) and 
received the President's 
Medal for Excellence as the 
top graduate from the 
School of Public 
Administration and 
Political Science. He 
received his Doctor of 
Jurisprudence form the 
University of Texas School 
of Law in Austin. White 
graduated with honors and 
earned a 3.62 GPA. He 
receive the Dean's 
Achievement Award for 
having the highest grade in 
Professional Responsibility 
(ethics) and was highly 
successful in moot court and 
mock trail competitions. 

Each candidate was asked 

tracks at a time that an 
ambulance needs to respond 
to a call on the other side of 
the track) "Because of these 
things I feel that locating 
the EMS facility with the 
jail, and doing it all at one 
time would be a particularly 
good thing for the County." 

The EMS building is 
housed in a cinderblock 
building that was once a 
laundromat. According to 
Judge Freeman, it is in 
pretty bad shape. 

If placed on the ballot in 
May; it will appear as 
Proposition #2. Proposition 
#1 would be to build a new 
jail facility. This was what 
Bond Council said must be 
done. They also told him 
that because Burn, Fletcher 
Gill is under contract to do 
the jail plan and because 
the EMS facility would be 
adjacent to the jail or 
possibly attached to the jail 
by way of a breezeway or 
some other connection, 
there would be no problem 
having that firm also design 
the EMS facility. To ensure 
that all was legal, the Bond  

to respond to the same set 
of questions. The questions 
and their responses follow. 

How many jury trails 
have you prosecuted? 

Manning: In the last 11 
months I have prosecuted 
three jury trials. I sat first 
chair in my first two jury 
trials, which means I had 
the responsibility of making 
all the decisions regarding 
the prosecution. Guilty 
verdicts were rendered in 
all three cases. Of course, I 
have handled many bench 
trials over the course of my 
employment as Assistant 

Cindy Stormer 

Cooke County Attorney. It 
is up to the defendant 
whether he or she wants a 
bench trial or a jury trial. 

Stormer: I have tried 
many jury trials, I am not 
sure of the exact number 
because I started over 
seventeen years ago, but I 
know I have done more than 
thirty jury trials. Most were 
with the Tarrant County 
District Attorney's office as 

Council drafted the order 
for the Court to enter into 
an additional contract with 
Burns, Fletcher & Gill to 
proceed with the schematics 
and design phase of an EMS 
building adjacent to the new 
jail. 

Architect Norris Fletcher 
assured Commissioners 
Court that his firm had 
done a number of fire 
stations and EMS plans and 
it would not be a new sort of 
venture for them. "It really 
makes sense to combine the 
two projects, both 
logistically and on the same 
site," said Fletcher. He 
projected having the 
schematic phase for both 
done by the first week of 
March. The county needs a 
firm dollar amount by 
March 11 to get the 
propositions on the May 
ballot. 

A public hearing is 
scheduled for Feb 24 on the 
Susquehanna Radio Tower 
proposed for the Lake Ray 
Roberts area. There have 
been protests from some of 

See EMS, Pg. 3 

an Assistant District 
Attorney. I have also tried 
jury trials in the Cooke 
County District Court and 
surrounding counties. I 
have also tried countless 
trials before the Court (non-
jury trials). 

White: I have tried 
approximately 13 jury 
trials. Eleven of those trials 
were in criminal cases, 
including a Capital Murder 
and two Aggravated Sexual 
Assault of Children cases 
tried in Cooke County's 
District Court with District 
Attorney Janelle 
Haverkamp while I was 
serving as her ASsistant 
District Attorney. At least 8 
of my jury trials were in 
felony criminal cases, and 
all of my jury trials occurred 
during the past 8 years. 

I have also handled 
numerous contested non-
jury trials, probation 
revocation hearings, 
suppression hearings, and 
habeas corpus hearings as 
both prosecutor and defense 
counsel. 

As DA, what criteria 
would you use in seeking the 
death penalty in a capital 
murder case? 

Manning: Well, the law 
dictates for prosecutors the 

Cooke County District 
Attorney Janelle 
Haverkamp seeks the 
position of Cooke County 
District Judge. 

Janelle Haverkamp 
graduated as the 
valedictorian of her class at 
Lindsay High School in 
1977. She attended Texas 
Tech University where she 
graduated in 1981 Summa 
Cum Laude - with Highest 
Honors. While at Texas 
Tech, she maintained a 
grade point average of 4.0 
and was honored as the 
"Highest Ranking Senior in 
the School of Arts and 
Sciences" and as the Phi 
Alpha Theta Outstanding 
Undergraduate. Haverkamp 
then attended Southern 
Methodist University School 
of Law, graduating in 1984. 

She returned to Cooke 
County and upon becoming 
licensed in November 1984, 
Haverkamp was appointed 
as Cooke County Attorney. 
Haverkamp served as 
County Attorney for five 
years. During her term as 
County Attorney, 
Haverkamp successfully 
tried numerous cases before 
Cooke County juries. She 
convicted thousands of 
misdemeanor defendants 
and disposed of over 5,000 
misdemeanor cases. As 
County Attorney, 
Haverkamp received the 
American Police Hall of 
Fame Honor Award for 
Distinguished Achievement 
in Public Service. 
Haverkamp served as an 
Instructor in Criminal Law,  

elements that make up a 
capital murder case. 
Although it is impossible to 
make an exclusive list of 
considerations I would 
ensure that seeking the 
death penalty for a 
defendant rather than a life 
sentence would be based on 
permissible considerations. 
The heinousness of the 
crime would be paramount. 
One would look at the 
vulnerability of the victim, 
the facts of the case, and the 
history of the defendant. I 
hesitate to offer up a pat 
answer to an obviously 

Roger White 

L aw 	Enforcement 
Procedures and Texas Trial 
Practices at North Central 
Texas College and also 
served as an instructor at 
the Texoma Police 
Academy. 

After serving as County 
Attorney, Haverkamp went 
into private practice for 
three years, practicing 
primarily family law related 
litigation. Haverkamp noted 
that the vast majority of the 
cases tried in the Cooke 
County District Court are 
family law related cases. 

Haverkamp become 
District Attorney on Jan. 1, 
1993. At the end of her 
term, she will be the longest 
serving District Attorney in 
Cooke County history. 
During her term, the 
District Attorney's Office 
has disposed of over 3,500 
felony cases. According to 
the office of Court 
Administration which 
compiles statistics for the 
District Courts of Texas, the 
Cooke County District 
Attorney's Office disposed of 
369 cases during the past 
state fiscal year ending Aug. 
31, 2003. 

Haverkamp has tried 
numerous cases before a 
jury including Aggravated 
Sexual Assault of Child 
Cases, Aggravated Robbery 
Cases, and three Capital 
Murder Cases. Haverkamp 
has not lost a jury trial she 
personally tried before a 
jury as District Attorney. 
During her term as District 
Attorney, jurors have 
assessed maximum  

complicated question. The 
facts of the case would 
dictate the punishment 
sought, and without a set of 
facts, this is mere 
conjecture. 

Stormer: Of course the 
statutes of Texas govern 
which cases can be tried as 
capital murder cases and I 
would follow the statues 
(basically it is when a. 
murder is committed in 
conjunction with another 
enumerated offense). A 
district attorney must 
balance several factors, 
including the facts and the 
allocation of limited 
resources, in determining 
whether it is in the best 
interests of the people to go 
forward with a capital 
murder prosecution. As an 
attorney who has dedicated 
my career to justice, I will 
prosecute to the fullest any 
case which warrants the 
imposition of the death 
penalty. I have worked on 
death penalty cases in the 
past. Two of my friends and 
co-workers were police 
officers who were killed in 
the line of duty. And my 
dear friend Chris Marshall 
was a prosecutor killed in 
the line of duty. His 

See DA. Pg. 2 

Janelle Haverkamp 

sentences including 17 life 
sentences. 

Haverkamp noted she is 
the better qualified 
candidate to serve the 
citizens of Cooke County as 
District Judge because she 
has actually tried cases and 
appeared in the District 
Court and is familiar with 
the court's docket. 
Haverkamp noted that her 
opponent has never filed a 
single case nor has he ever 
appeared as a lawyer in the 
Cooke County District 
Court. 

"Retiring Judge Woodlock, 
has served the citizens of 
Cooke County with honor 
and distinction for the last 
16 years. 1 pledge to serve 
with the same honesty, 
integrity and dedication," 
said Haverkamp, noting 
that her opponent could 

See HAVERICAMP, Pg. 2 

'EMS building to be considered 

Haverkamp seeks office of 
Cooke County District Judge 



11PB Muenster State Bank 
201 N. Main. Muenster. 940-759-2257 

	
FDIC 

oosc'
red 

SP wi  

PAGE 2 - FEBRUARY 20, 2004 THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 

DA CAN DI DATES 	 Continued from Pg. 1 

ti 4.-•••• 
der' 	 11111 	'A.SZ: - 

I 

a 

that area's residents. 
Wolf, Tidwell & McCoy, 

Attorneys at Law was hired 
by Commissioners Court to 
provide legal advice 
pertaining to the tower 
issue. "I personally feel like 
we should because of the 
possibility of a lawsuit 
against the County. 
Regardless of how this goes 
we certainly need support 
and advice," remarked 
Judge Freeman before 
Commissioners made their 
unanimous vote on hiring 
the law firm. 

Also discussed at Friday, 
Feb. 13's special meeting 
was having Burns, Fletcher, 

Alt 

HAVERKAMP 	 

serve only one full term, 
because the Texas 
Constitution provides that 
there is mandatory 
retirement for District 
Judges at the age of 75. 

Haverkamp noted that 
her opponent has claimed 
that it will cost the county 
money for visiting Judges if 
she is elected. However, she 
states the fact is that 
Judges from different 
counties routinely exchange 
benches when a conflict 
arises. Further, that under 
the state's Visiting Judge 
Program, should a conflict 
arise and there is not a 
current sitting Judge 
available to exchange 
benches, the state will 
provide a retired visiting 
Judge and pay the salary of 

murderer received the death 
penalty. As the District 
Attorney of this county, I 
would insure that the 
process is fair so that justice 
is done. 

White: I would not have a 
list of set criteria, I would 
seek the death penalty as 
justice requires. All Capital 
Murders are horrible 
crimes, but some are so 
heinous as to shock the 
conscience. Those are the 
type of capital crimes for 
which I would ask the jury 
for the ultimate penalty. 
Some factors that would 
have to be considered 
include the number of 
victims, the age and 
vulnerability of the 
victim(s), the wishes of the 
victim's family members, 
the strength of the case, and 
the prior criminal record of 
the defendant. 

What do you feel should be 
done to reduce the drug 
problem in Cooke County? 

Manning: From the 
standpoint of prosecution, 
obviously we need to 
continue to arrest and 
prosecute those committing 
drug-related offenses. 
Mandatory drug treatment 
programs in negotiated 
pleas, at the defendant's 
expense, would be 
beneficial. I agree with 
many of those in law 
enforcement that some kind 
of low cost drug treatment 
program within the 
community would be 
advantageous; however, 
that requires funding not 
available at the current 
time. As a Cooke County 
citizen, I feel that educating 
our children about drug 
issues remains an 
important means of 
addressing the drug 
problem. I feel comfortable 
saying that a majority of 
crime involves drug use in 
one way or another and only 
through addressing the 
drug problem in Cooke 
County will we be able to 
reduce the number of crimes 
committed here. 

Stormer: ( I ) It is very 
important to keep arrested 
criminals in jail. It is 
required that a legal 
document called a 
"Complaint" be filled out 

:Within 48 hours of arrestor 
have to be 

:released from jail. In 
Tarrant County as an 
Assistant District Attorney, 
I worked after hours 
preparing these Complaints 
for the police. When this is 
not done in Cooke County, 
many criminals are released 
under this 48-hour rule. I 
emphasize that I am not 
placing blame on anyone in 
this regard, just stating that 
I know how to fix the 
problem. 

(2) I would like to see 
more offenders, especially 
young, first time offenders, 
go through a rehabilitation 
program instead of being 
warehoused with other 
more serious offenders. 

(3) I will work with and 
train law enforcement and 
as a team with law 
enforcement these offenses 
will be more aggressively 
pursued. 

White: Drug cases will a 
top priority if I am elected 

District Attorney, because 
they lead to so many other 
offenses, including 
Burglary, Theft, Anhydrous 
Ammonia 	offenses, 
Aggravated 	Assault, 
Murder, and Capital 
Murder. I will aggressively 
prosecute and apply 
pressure to those who sell 
and manufacture drugs, 
especially 
methamphetamine. 

I plan to ask the Sheriff, 
police chiefs of our county's 
municipalities, federal 
agencies, and drug task 
force to meet with me so we 
can plan an overall strategy 
to work together and rid 
Cooke County of its drug 
problem. Although these 
law enforcement agencies 
currently work together to 
some extent, I feel that 
more cooperation and 
communication between 
them would be beneficial. 
Either I or one of my 
Assistant District Attorneys 
will be on call (on a rotating 
basis) at all times to assist 
law enforcement officers 
and agencies with legal 
issues, including search 
warrants. 

What do you feel makes 
you the best candidate for 
DA? 

Manning: I am the only 
prosecutor running for the 
top prosecutor position in 
the county. 

Many of the defendants in 
Cooke County are repeat 
offenders. As Cooke County 
District Attorney I will 
never be in a position of 
being unable to work on a 
case because I have 
previously represented the 
defendant on another 
criminal or civil action. 
Neither of my opponents 
can claim the same. I have 
strived for employment that 
makes a difference in the 
community, never making 
financial considerations my 
priority. In the last two 
years I have completed close 
to 100 hours of continuing 
legal education geared 
towards keeping 
prosecutors up-to-date on 
the many changes our 
legislature makes in the law 
each time it meets. My 
opponents cannot say the 
same. 
My passion is criminal law. 
Private practice' is not an 
option because although 
defense work is lucrative, I 
am a prosecutor. 

I am a member of the 
Cooke County Coalition 
Against Sexual and Family 
Violence. Fellow members 
include individuals from the 
Cooke County Sheriff's 
Office, the Gainesville 
Police Department, Friends 
of the Family, Mother's 
Against Drunk Driving, 
Child's Protective Services 
as a Division of the Texas 
Department of Protective 
and Regulatory Services, 
United Way workers, and 
others from organizations in 
our county committed 
towards healing those 
harmed by crime. My 
concern as a prosecutor is to 
see that justice is done. 
Justice includes seeking 
restitution from the 
defendant in an effort to 
make the victim of crime 
whole. Defense attorneys  

are charged with zealously 
representing their client. If 
you or a loved one is a 
victim of crime, who would 
you want to prosecute the 
person who harmed you? 
Once again, I am the best 
candidate because I am the 
only prosecutor running for 
the position and because I 
possess the integrity, 
attitude, and commitment 
to the profession necessary 
to fill the position of Cooke 
County District Attorney. 

Stormer: I am an 
experienced prosecutor with 
a combined 27 years 
experience in the law (17 as 
an attorney practicing 
criminal law and 10 in 
police work before becoming 
an attorney). I have served 
as a Special Prosecutor in 
Cooke County when 
requested to do so. I have 
donated my time and efforts 
to various organizations in 
Cooke County for many 
years (including the Child 
Welfare Board, Home 
Hospice, etc.). I attend 
church at Sacred Heart. 
I lived in Cooke County for 
the better part of my life. I 
lived on a farm in Cooke 
County as a child, attended 
Cooke County Junior 
College, and have been 
practicing law for seventeen 
years (thirteen of these in 
Cooke County). I am well 
respected by my legal peers 
all over the State. I am 
frequently hired by other 
attorneys to assist them 
with their complex criminal 
felony work. You can view 
some of these endorsements 
for yourself on my web page 
at www,cindystomer.com . 
I have been an instructor of 
prosecutors 	(Basic 
Prosecution 	Course 
sponsored by the Texas 
District and County 
Attorney's Association) and 
police. 

I am currently endorsed 
as the best candidate for 
Cooke County District 
Attorney by the largest 
police association in the 
state of Texas C.L.E.A.T. 
Combined Law Enforcement 
Association of Texas in 
Austin. 

I was selected as the 
C.A.S.A. Court Appointed 
Special Advocates of North 
Texas, Inc. Attorney of the 
Year • for • 2 0 0 Ilan 
organization that assists 
abused and neglected 
children in court). 

I have handled all stages 
of criminal cases from the 
first call that comes into the 
police department 
(dispatch) to the attorney 

By Janet Felderhoff 
For this year only the 

election date for candidates 
in city, school, and hospital 
elections has been changed 
from the first Saturday in 
May to the third Saturday 
in May. At that time there 
may also be some bond 
issues on the ballot. 

Those who seek to serve 
in any of these positions 
should file before the close 
of business Monday, Mar. 
15. Monday, Feb. 16 was the 
first day to file. 
Requirements to file are 
available at the 
administration office of the 
entity. 

There are three seats up 
for election on the Muenster 
Memorial Hospital Board of 
Directors. These are all 
three-year terms. Directors 
whose terms are expiring 
are John Aytes. Kenny 
Klement, and Angelo 
Nasche  

4 	r, 

A media tour last week at the 
construction site of the North 
Texas Medical Center in 
Gainesville showed much 
progress since the August '03 
tour. Dry walls are up in 
portions of the building and 
decorative stone and brick 
have begun covering the 
outside. Inset, Lucy Krahl 
conducted the tour, noting 
that the project is on 
schedule. 
Janie Hartman photo 

defending the case in the 
appellate courts. 

In the trial courts, I have 
personally and successfully 
prosecuted hundreds of 
felonies and I have filed 
approximately 300 briefs in 
the Courts of Appeals of 
Texas, almost all of which 
were criminal felonies. I am 
the only candidate in this 
race licensed to practice law 
in the United States 
Supreme Court. This means 
that I have the ability, 
experience, and reputation 

See DA. Pg. 3 

On the Muenster City 
Council aldermen whose 
terms expire are Troy 
Sicking, Place 1, John 
Pagel, Place 2, and Jewel 
Otto, Place 4. 

Muenster ISD has two 
places on the Board of 
Trustees with terms 
expiring in May. They are 
Clifford, Sicking, Place 2, 
and Wanda Flusche Place 1. 

The City of Lindsay has 
three positions with 
expiring terms. Mayor 
Norbert Mages, and 
aldermen Wilbert Block and 
Robin Rose now hold those 
places. These are two-year 
terms and the aldermen are 
elected at large. Filing 
packets are available at 
Lindsay City Hall. 

The Lindsay ISD Board 
has two seats up for 
election. Richard Connett 
and David Arendt currently 
serve in those positions. 

Gill Architects proceed with 
schematics and design 
phase for an addition to the 
Cooke County Library. This 
item was tabled. - ' 

Denise Cheaney and Tom 
Holland of the Bond Council 
recommended not doing it 
at the present time. They 
felt an rfq (request for 
qualifications) should be 
done before engaging an 
architect. Judge Freeman 
said he felt that the firm 
could do the job, but there 
might be legal issues 
involved and he didn't want 
to do anything that might 
jeopardize the bond election 
for the county jail. 

Continued from Pg. 1 

the visiting Judge. It does 
not cost Cooke County. 

Haverkamp is 45 years 
old and is the daughter of 
Frank and Angela 
Haverkamp. She has one 
daughter Katherine Grace 
Haverkamp. She and her 
daughter are members of 
St. Mary's Catholic Church. 
Haverkamp stated, "The 
greatest joy of my life has 
been the adoption of my 
wonderful daughter 
Katherine, who is five years 
old. I intend to raise her in 
Cooke County and because 
of her, I certainly have a 
vested interest in the future 
of Cooke County." 

Pd. Pol. Adv. by Janelle  M. 
Haverkamp Campaign. Mr. Ed F. 
Moody. Campaign Treasurer. 110 

San Chez Drive West, Lake Kiowa, 

Texas 76240 
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Filing time opens for city, 
school, and hospital elections 

EMS 	 Continued from Pg. 1 

2-WEEK EVENTS CALENDAR 
Sunday, February 22, 2004 

Muenster Museum Open 1 -4 pm 

Sunday, February 29. 2004 
Muenster Museum Open 1 -4 PM 

SH Swen Team Chicken 
Enchilada Dinner, 5.30pm. 
Community Center 
MMH Open House, 

Anniversary 

Monday. February 13. 2004 

Monday. March I. 2004 

Tuesday, February 24, 2004 

Exercise Class, 10,30-11:30, 
SNAP Center 
Marketing Club meeting, 7ee, 
Gainesville Farm Bureau 

Tuesday, March 2. 2001 

Exercise Class. 10,30-11:30, 
S N.A.P. Center 
MMH Auxiliary meeting, lea, 
Administration Office 

Wednesday, February 25, 2004 

Exercise Class, 10.30-11:30. 
S.N.A.P. Center 
Religious Ed Mass. 6:30vm 
SHS Advisory Council 
meeting, 7:30 POI 

Farmer/Rancher Symposium, 
NCTC Theater, 8ox-3:30pm 
ASH WEDNESDAY 
Wednesday, March 3, 2001 
Exercise Class, 10:30-11:30, 
S.N.A.P. Center 
C of C Board meeting. 5.30em 

Thursday, February 26, 2004 

Exercise Class, 10:30-11:30. 
S.N.A.P Center 
Muenster Museum Open 1-4p 

Thursday. March 1, 2004 
Exercise Class, 10 . 30-11 30, 
S.N.A.P Center 
Muenster Museum Open 1-4pm 
Muenster ISD - NO CLASSES 

Friday, February 27, 2004 

Muenster Museum Open 1 -4 nu 

Friday, March 5, 2004 

Muenster Museum Open 1-4 ciu 

Muenster ISD - NO CLASSES 

Saturday. February 16, 2001 

Jaycee Banquet 

Saturday, March 6, 2004 

ABB5 Women s Center 
Banquet. 6-9P... Centenn,a! 
Hall, Lindsay 



Obituaries 
Bobbie Connell Reeves 

1927-2004 
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Phil Ryan 	

Weldon Lucas 
Former Texas Ranger - 

• Cooke and Denton 

I  Wise and Jack Counties 
Former Texas Ranger - 

Sheriff - 
Wise County, Texas 	 V---- 	

Counties 

Former She 
Sheriff - 
Denton County, Texas I 

1  Charlie Fleming 	

We have worked with Janelle Haverkamp in her capacity 	
-\"64-1° as District Attorney and know her to be 

Hardworking and Tough On Crime. 
(j/..e./.— itZ/~7 

 

't 
We believe she will continue to exhibit these traits 	

Johnny Waldrip - 

Former Texas Ranger - Former Texas Ranger - 

Llano Counties * Grayson, Collin and 
Fannin Counties 

as your District Judge 	 Cooke, Grayson and 

Chief Deputy - 	
and urge you to vote for her 	 Former Chief Deputy - L Denton County, Texas for District Judge on March 9, 2004. 	 Grayson County, Texas 

Pd. Pol. Ad. by Janelle M. Haverkamp Campaign, Mr. Ed F. Moody, Campaign Treasurer, 110 San Chez Drive West, Lake Kiowa, Texas 76240 * * * * * * * LI 
pfk 

JANELLE HAVERKAMP 

C 	
FOR 

DISTRICT JUDGE 
Oith, 

THE ONLY CANDIDATE PROVEN 
TO BE HARDWORKING AND TOUGH ON CRIME 
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Calling all Texans - 
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It pays to recycle! 

Bobbie Connell Reeves of 
Muenster died at Pecan 
Tree Manor on Saturday, 
Feb. 14, 2004 at age 76. 

She was born on June 17, 
1927 in Ringold, Texas to 
James and Bertha Crowe 
McElroy. On Jan. 3, 1969, 
she was married to C.G. 
Reeves in Weatherford, 
Texas. 

She was a member of 
Marysville Baptist Church; 
and was retired from 
Pangburn Candy Company, 
after being employed there 
more than 18 years. 

Survivors are her 
husband, C.G. Reeves of 
Muenster; two • sons and 
daughter-in-law Glenn and 
Sheron Connell of Tulsa, 
Oklahoma, and Robert 
Connell of Whitesboro; and 
three daughters and son-in-
law, Jannet and Sam 
Fleitman of Oak Point, 
Texas, Cathy Walker of 
Portsmouth, Virginia, and 
Jennifer Reeves of 
Muenster. There are 13 
grandchildren. 

Visitation was held at 
Clement-Keel Funeral 
Home on Monday from 7 
p.m. to 8 p.m. 

Funeral services were 

Bobbie Connell Reeves 

held Tuesday, Feb. 17 at 2 
p.m. at Marysville Baptist 
Church, conducted by Bro. 
Aubrey Spires. Song leader 
was Fred King, and pianist 
was Bobby Connell, son of 
Mrs. Reeves. 

Burial in Marysville 
Cemetery was directed by 
Clement-Keel Funeral 
Home. Pallbearers were 
C.G. Reeves, Archie Walker, 
Daniel Walker, Travis 
Walker, Bill Richey, and 
Terry Bartel. 

Also attending were many 
friends from out of town. 

cotton harvest was over. 
At the time, we lived in 

town, so Mom sent me to 
the public school for the 
first two weeks. That's 
where I first came to know a 
kindly but firm Professor 
Linner. I was seated with a 
boy - I believe his family 
name was Lehnertz, but not 
one of the Joe Lehnertz 
family. He had a rather 
high-pitched voice, while 
mine was just the opposite. 

One day, as happens with 
kids, we got into a little 
scrap. I had a pretty good 
mop of hair which he 
promptly took hold of. His 

Do you have a used cell 
phone collecting dust 
somewhere in your home or 
office? Chances are you 
probably do - the average 
American replaces his or 
her cell phone every 12 
months. The result? 
Americans discard more 
than 130 million used cell 
phones a year. That's 4 cell 
phones per second! All of 
which adds up to 65,000 
tons of potentially toxic 
waste generated annually. 
The phones' disposal in 
landfills or incinerators can 
have a widespread impact 
on public health and the 
environment. The toxic 
material from a single 
phone is capable of polluting 
158,200 gallons of water! 

Keep Texas Beautiful, a 
state affiliate of Keep 
America Beautiful, has just 
announced an innovative 
new program that addresses 
this growing concern and 
simultaneously provides 
community organizations, 
schools, individuals, and 
businesses with • an 
environmentally-friendly 
method to raise money. In 
the Cell Phone Recycling 
Fundraiser, participants are 
paid for each digital cell 
phone collected, and 
contributors can receive a 
tax deduction for turning in 
their retired cell phones. 

Keep Texas Beautiful is 
launching the program in 

hair was cut pretty short so 
I grabbed his ear, and hung 
on. 

"Fesser, Fesser, Ed Cler 
pulled my ear," he piped up 
in his high voice. Well, I had 
something to tell too, and in 
my rather low voice I said, 
"He pulled by hair first." 

The good professor 
seemed to have a bit of a 
problem keeping his face 
straight, as he advised both 
of us in a stern voice, to be 
quiet and behave. 

Two weeks later the 
parochial school opened and 
I spent the next eight school 
terms there.  

cooperation 	with 
EcoPhones, a Texas based 
cell phone recycler. 
EcoPhones provides all 
promotional, program, and 
collection materials free of 
charge. They refurbish and 
resell cell phones that have 
value and recycle the 
remainder in accordance 
with EPA regulations. 

"We are very proud to be 
working with Keep Texas 
Beautiful on this program. 
Today only about 5% of 
discarded cell phones are 
properly recycled. Working 
together, we feel we can 
create greater awareness of 
the problem and increase 
that percentage 
dramatically," said Charles 
Drayton, one of the founders 
of EcoPhones. 

For more information or 
to start your own cell phone 
recycling fundraiser, visit 
www.ktb.org . 
committee consists of 
community members, 
business leaders, parents, 
staff members, students, 
and one board member. The 
committees 	include 
Academic/ 	Support, 
Athletics, Facilities, Fine 
Arts, Technology, and 
Vocational. 

"The Board's actions 
during the past three years 
demonstrates that input 
from community members, 
parents, staff members, and 
students is critical in 
providing a road map for 
success," Steelman told the 
committee members. 
"During the last three years 
the district has seen much 
success, which can be 
attributed to 
recommendations made by 
these committees and their 
willingness not only to look 
at the committee needs, but 
to keep in mind the whole 
educational program in 
order to continue success at 
Muenster ISD." 

Preparing your 
home for winter 

Close off unneeded 
rooms and place towels or 
rags in cracks under the 
doors  

needed to be admitted to the 
bar of the highest court in 
the land. 

It is also the DA's job to 
represent the State on 
appeal and keep their 
conviction from being 
overturned on appeal. 

White: I am the only 
candidate for DA who has 
worked as a prosecutor in 
the Cooke County District 
Attorney's Office. No one 
has a better idea of what 
goes on in the office than 
someone who has actually 
worked there, and I served 
as Assistant District 
Attorney under Janelle 
Haverkamp for two years. 

I am also the only 
candidate for DA who has 
tried a felony jury trial in 
Cooke County's District 
Court. I am the only 
candidate who is actively 
engaged in felony criminal 
cases, and prosecuting and 
trying felony criminal cases 
is by far the largest 
responsibility of the District 
Attorney's Office. My 
courtroom skills and 
knowledge of current 
criminal law make me the 
best-qualified candidate for 
the job. 

I am a Cooke County 
taxpayer just like the other 
citizens of this county. I 
plan to implement changes 
that will streamline the 
process of handling cases 
and save money for the 
taxpayers by reducing the 
jail population and overall 
fees of court appointed 
attorneys. Like many 
District Attorneys Offices in 
Texas, I will implement an 
"open file" policy that will 
allow defense attorneys 
equal access to police 
reports and other' 
documents in the District 
Attorney's file. This will 
allow defense attorneys to 
quickly see the 
overwhelming evidence 
against their clients and 
facilitate faster disposition 
of the cases. Faster 
disposition of the cases 
means defendants will 
spend less time in our 
County Jail and more time 
in the penitentiary. 

Why to you hope to serve 
as Cooke County's DA? 

Manning: I hope to serve 
as Cooke County District 
Attorney because it is a 
logical extension of my past 
employment in law 
enforcement and my current 
career as Assistant Cooke 
County Attorney. I 
currently prosecute 
misdemeanors in three 
courts and handle both 
misdemeanors and felonies 
when the perpetrators are 
juveniles. My commitment 
to prosecution is obvious. 
This is an opportunity to 
use the skills I have 
developed in the Cooke 
County Attorney's Office to 
further serve the citizens of 
Cooke County by 
prosecuting felony cases as 
Cooke County District 
Attorney. 

Stormer: 	 My 
qualifications 	and 
experience make me the 
best candidate for District 
Attorney. A lot of good 
people have asked me to run 
for this office. I have been 
listening to the concerns of 
many people. I am 
motivated by a strong desire 
for good government and a 
desire to work with lain 
enforcement to make Coolie 
County a better, safer plate 
to live. I hope to serve 
because I sincerely feel thit 
I can do the best job for 
Cooke County. 

White: My life is one of 
service. I have served my 
country, my state, and my 
community for many years 
as an infantry soldier, a 
jailer, a prison guard, and 
an Assistant District 
Attorney. It would be an 
honor to continue my 
service to Cooke County as 
your next District Attorney. 

I love Cooke County and 
want it to be a safe place for 
people to live, work, and 
raise their families. When a 
business or family is 
thinking of relocating to 
Cooke County, I want low 
crime and high conviction 
rates to be positive factcirs 
in that decision. Cooke 
County needs and deserves 
an aggressive, tough 
prosecutor who is both fair 
and honest to bring justice 
to those who violate our 
laws. I am that person. - 

In the fall of 1920, I must 
have been a real pain to my 
Mom. I would not be six 
until the latter part of 
January 1921, but she sent 
me to the public school 
because it opened two weeks 
earlier than the parochial 
school did. 

Kids who attended the 
parochial school were 
mostly helping their parents 
pick cotton, so it catered 
more to the needs of its 
supports. Many of the kids 
missed the entire first 
month of classes, so they 
had a lot of catching up to 

• do when, eventually, the 

From My Side of the Fence 



OLD AND NEW IN DRAFTING-Ernest Martin. a student from 
Muenster in the drafting technology program at North Central 
Texas College, shows a drawing done in CAD (computer-
aided drafting) to Claude Walter, a member of NCTC•s board 
of regents, also from Muenster. Looking on is Dr. Bob Ray, 
program coordinator, who says the "old-fashioned" drafting 
tables In the background are still around to help students 
gain a more solid grasp of the "pencil and ruler" 
fundamentals before moving to the computer. 

Courtesy photo 

Don't Pout! 

We didn't forget your 

birthday! 

Help 

Leonard Hartman 
celebrate hi. 

80th Birthday 
Sunday. Feb. 29th. 

l-4.pm. 
SH Communa■ Colter 

Meeting ROOM 

Come & 

• gift 

• 

Historical Commission 
votes for siding on Museum 

Allstate. 

agents. (40 
AGENCY 
	 S. 	 23 

FMW INSURANCE 

For more intonnao- , 
Can Fisher 
Paula Kerr 

Michelle Pruett 

, 

WE WANT GOOD INSURANCE,' 
E WORRIED inva COST TOO MUCH. 

Paint & Bod Shop For All Your Needs 

3  mules north at Hwy. 82 on FM 1200 

665-1112 

MOST PEOPLE WHO SWITCHED TO ALLSTATE AUTO INSURANCE 
SAVED MONEY. CALL ME . 

Anna Bral'el  (940) 759-4644 - 
PO. Box 69 • Mummer. Texas 76252 • fmwirixurance min net 

LET US E- FILE 
YOUR TAXES 

FASTER REFUNDS, MORE ACCURATE FILING 

Dues She IRS awe yOu vanes .  Gel yOu ,  ea. m nan the usual IrOls-v001 IRS tilt 
well prepare 05, return and Me n vet, the IRS eleCoOratalla Its a c'd d••e sn. 	nd, 

TOM'S (Oat prcol Irons the IRS VIM yOur ratan has hoe oce*DS* 	- 
and you'll gel your feudal even laser 

00 yOu owe more taxeS ,  VOu 100 can get the 	• :s • - 
make vaa, payment OV ROnl ISm 

La. to. naa.■ .0 mien map* taw 
Wry 

AUTHDRaEO - 	 40vipa ,  

4,ZZETZ, 
DUANE KNABE. CPA 

124 S 1 	• 	 - '59-4010 

lb ruiner twria 

 

522 E. Division 
940-759-FOOD (3663) 

PIZZA PERSONAL 	LARGE (14") GIANT (16") 
CHEESE 3.99 7.99 11.99 
4 MEAT 5.25 9.50 13.75 
VEGGIE 4.49 8.99 13.25 
BART'S PIZZA 5.25 9.25 13.25 

(HAMBURGER, BELL PEPPER & ONION) 

SUPREME 	6.75 	 10.75 14.75 
(PEPPERONI, CANADIAN BACON. HAMBURGER. MUSHROOMS, 

BELL PEPPERS. ONION, BLACK OLIVES ) 

EACH ADD ON: 	.50 	 1.00 	 1.25 
TASTY NIF.ATS  
PEPPERONI 
HAM 
ITALIAN SAUSAGE 
HAMBURGER 
BACON 
CANADIAN BACON 

VEGGIES 
ONION 
MUSHROOMS 
BELL PEPPERS 
JALAPENOS 
BLACK OLIVES 
GREEN OLIVES 

EXTRA 
CHEESE 
ANCHOVIES 
PINEAPPLE 
SLICED TOMATO 

PRIME BURGERS (INCLUDES LETTUCE, TOMATO & GOURMET CHIPS) 
1/3 LB. 	 1/2 LB. 

PRIME BURGER 	 3.95 	 4.95 
TOWER BURGER 	 4.50 	 5.50 

(UNCLE PAUL'S SPECIAL SAUCE) 

MUSHROOM ISS 
	

4.50 	 5.50 
ADD ON (111( ON. CHEESE) 	 .50 

COLD DRINKS 
	

1.00 

FREE DELIVERV AFTER 5 (MUENSTER ONLY' - MIN $10) 

HOURS: SUN/NION: 11-8 - THURS: 3-8 - FRI: 3-11 - SAT: 11-11 
	

I! 
ALL MEAT SUPPLIED BV FISCHER'S MARKET AND 

NALTERSCHEID MEAT CO. 
BREAD BAKED BY BAYER'S KOLONIALV•AREN 

i
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NCTC drafting program blends old and new 
. The drafting program at 

North Central Texas 
College-both in terms of 
s ‘tudents 	and  
equipment-presents an 
interesting mix of both the 
new and the, well, not so 
new. According to Dr. Bob 
Itay, program coordinator, 
it's a sign of the times in 
technical education. 

Pointing to a 60-
something student focusing 
intently on his computer 
terminal screen and to a 
student at the next terminal 
Who is fresh out of high 
school, Dr. Ray says this is 
typical of the makeup of 
most of the classes in the 
program. 

"We are seeing a lot of 
students who have returned 
to school after a long 
absence from any kind of 
classroom," he said. °Some 
are seeking new skills for a 
whole new kind of career, 
while others, who may have 
been working in drafting 
and design or some related 
field for years, are looking 
to upgrade their skills and 
get up to speed with CAD." 

That's computer-aided 
drafting, Dr. Ray explains, 
pointing out that the days of 
drafting tables, T-squares 

Muenster Historical 
Commission President 
Celine Dittfurth is asking 
that anyone with items of 
interest from the 40 years of 
Muenster Memorial 
Hospital share them. A 
special exhibit is planed for 
Sunday, Feb. 28 at the 
Muenster Museum. It will 
Oincide with an Open 
House at the Muenster 
Hospital celebrating its 40 
years of existence in the 
lbcal community. 

Members of the Muenster 
Historical Commission 
noted unanimously to 
improve the appearance of 
the Ben and Aggie Fette 
Seyler Muenster Museum 
by paying to have white 
aluminum siding put on the 
building. Jewel Otto 
brought a cost estimate of 
$11,800. She said she'd been 
Cold that repainting 
properly would be costly. 
The siding is guaranteed 
and unlike the wood 
exterior it doesn't require 
expensive repainting every 
few years. 

It was announced that an 
Executive decision had been 
Made to purchase the 
Hansel Und Gretel Haus 
Germanfest booth for $100. 

Officer election will be 
held at the March 11 
regular meeting. Members 
of the nominating 
committee are Jewel Otto .  

and sharppencils are just 
about gone forever. 

Then why are some old-
fashioned drafting tables 
still around in NCTC's 
computer-dominated . 
drafting lab? Dr. Ray says 
many of the industry 
representatives on his 
advisory committee still like 
to see students exposed to 
at least some of the "pencil 
and ruler basics." 

"They believe, and I have 
to agree, that this can give 
students a much stronger 
grasp of the fundamental 
principles of drafting and 
design-principles they can 
then apply when they get on 
the computer. After all. the 
computer is merely a 
different, more modern tool 
for doing the same basic job, 
only faster, with more 
precision and without the 
need for a big eraser." 

Ernest Martin, an older 
student from Muenster who 
is enrolled this semester in 
two drafting classes, said 
his goal is to broaden his 
work-related skills. As 
facilities manager for the 
Sacred Heart Church and 
schools, he said acquiring 
solid skills in blueprint 
reading and basic drafting 

Some suggested items are 
old photos of hospital staff; 
uniforms of nurses or 
doctors, especially from the 
time uniforms and caps 
were worn; old equipment; 
and other items that tell the 
hospital's story. To loan an 
item for the exhibit, contact 
Celine Dittfurth or bring it 
by the Museum during open 
hours, which are 1-4 p.m. 
Thursdays. Fridays, and 
Sundays. 

Janie Hartman. and Betty 
Kralicke. Also member dues 
of $5 are to be paid in 
March. 

President Celine Dittfurth 
announced that she had 
devised a cleaning schedule 
for workers. Certain rooms 
will be cleaned depending 
on the day of the week. 

Thirteen members 
attended the February 
meeting. New members are 
always welcome. The group 
meets on the second 
Thursday of the month at 8 
a.m. in the Muenster 
Museum.  

are essential to him. 
"We are in process of 

putting diagrams, 
schematics and floor plans 
for our entire physical plant 
on computer, including the 
location of all pipes, cables, 
wiring and so on," he said. 
"It's going to make a huge 
difference in my ability to 
supervise maintenance and 
oversee renovation 
projects." 

"For instance, we are 
undertaking the complete 
renovation of a rectory 
building constructed back in 
1916," observed Claude 
Walter, member of the 
NCTC board of regents from 
Muenster and a member of 
the Sacred Heart parish. 
"It's a complex and delicate 
job, and the skills and 
knowledge Ernest is gaining 
here at NCTC are going to 
be of tremendous help." 

On Monday evenings, 
Martin takes a technical 
drawing course taught by 
Dr. Ray, and on Tuesday 
nights he is enrolled in CAD 
I taught by Robert Nutter, 
adjunct instructor who also 
teaches drafting at 
Gainesville High School. 

It had been many years 

(  New  Arrival) 

Flusche 
Mark and Jennifer 

Flusche joyfully announce 
the birth of their first child, 
a daughter on Wednesday, 
Feb. 11, 2004. Emily Marie 
was born at St. Joseph's 
Hospital in Bryan, Texas 
weighing 9 lb. 1/2 oz. and 
measuring 22 inches in 
length. First-time 
grandparents are Connie 
and Vernon Dittrich of 
Houston, and Harold and 
Jeannine Flusche of 
Muenster. Great-
grandmothers are Hazel 
Flusche and Rose Hofbauer, 
both of Muenster, and Helen 
Dittrich of Weimar. Texas. 

College 
honor roll 
students 
University of Arkansas 
The fall semester honor 

roll for undergraduate 
students in the Fulbright 
College of Arts and Sciences 
at the University of 
Arkansas has been 
announced. 

Named to the Dean's List 
was Christopher Jackson of 
Muenster. Students named 
to the dean's list rank in the 
upper 10 percent of students 
in their individual school or 
college and carry a 
minimum of 12 credit hours 
per semester. 

Christopher is the son of 
Jay and Laura Jackson.  

since Martin had been a 
student at NCTC the first 
time, attending for three 
semesters before entering 
the workforce and 
concentrating on raising a 
family. He came back to 
NCTC by way of Grayson 
College in Sherman, where 
he is completing 
requirements for a degree in 
air conditioning and 
heating, a program NCTC 
has never offered. 

However, thanks to a 
special articulation 
agreement between NCTC 
and Grayson, Martin is able 
to complete many of the 
required support courses for 
that degree on the NCTC 
Gainesville Campus. The 
same is true for Grayson 
students in some technical 
programs offered by NCTC 
such as equine science. 

"That really makes it 
convenient for me," Martin 
said, "and so does being 
able to enroll in the drafting 
program right here close to 
home. It enables me to go to 
school, continue working 
full time and save a lot of 
money to boot." 

Another focus of NCTC's 

Dominic Xavier Nervo 
celebrated his fourth 
birthday on Sunday, Dec. 14 
in the home of his parents, 
Donna and Nicolas Nervo of 
Arlington. His actual 
birthdate is Dec. 12. 

Dominic was excited to 
have a dump truck theme, 
chosen especially by him. 
Mobiles and cutouts of road 
signs, construction 
equipment, and carpentry 
tools complemented the 
party room. Colors of red, 
blue, yellow, green, and 
black were emphasized in 
the decor. 

Guests enjoyed a baked 
chicken supper with all the 
trimmings, made by the 
celebrant's father. Cake and 
ice cream were served as 
dessert. The large banana 
sheet cake was made by 
Dominic's mother and 
decorated with tiny replicas 
of various construction 
machinery at each corner 
and lettered with "Happy 
Birthday Dominic". 

Party favors, gifts, and 
picture taking completed a 
happy 

 d 

Special guests included 
Dominic's parents and older 
brother, Alexander Nicolas, 
and maternal grandmother 
Rachel Hennigan of 
Muenster.  

drafting 	technology 
program in the coming year, 
according to Dr. Ray, will be 
to establish articulation 
agreements with area four-
year schools such as the 
University of North Texas. 

"We're working with UNT 
and other area universities 
to establish agreements 
that will allow graduates of 
our program to transfer 

Losers let it happen, 
winners make it happen. 

Dominic Nervo 

easily and seamlessly into 
their baccalaureate level 
programs in engineering 
and related fields." 

Persons wishing to learn 
more about the drafting 
technology program at 
NCTC may contact Dr. Bob 
Ray at 940-668-7731, ext. 
380, or by email. More 
information also is available 
online at www.nctc.edu . 

Preparing your 
home for winter 

Check on friends or 
family members whose 
health or age may place 
them at greater risk from 
severe winter weather.  

Sacred Heart 
Swim Team to 
serve Enchilada 
dinner 

Sacred Heart Swim Team 
will be hosting a chicken 
enchilada dinner on 
Sunday, Feb. 29 at the 
Sacred Heart Community 
Center. Serving time begins 
at 5:30 p.m. Tickets are $6 
for adults and $4 for 
children under 12. See any 
swim team member for 
tickets or call 759-4569 or 
736-4625. 

MMH memorabilia 
sought for Museum 

Dominic Nervo celebrates 
his fourth birthday 



Baptism 

OTHER DEALERS' YEAR-END OVERSTOCKS • SPECIAL PURCHASES 
Pilot Point Ford has made special purchases of vehicles from year-end dealer overstocks! 
Save MAJOR MONEY at our MAJOR EUY.OUT sale. Many special purchase vehicleswith below book prices 
and extra-low payments! Choose from hundreds of Trucks, &Ws, Cars and Vans. Hurry, Last Week! 

Automat, Sport Kg., Alloys. CD, TM/Copse, 402, Flares. 
177884 

6 0 Dose!, speed Aulo. Snort Wheel Base Alloys. Power Seat A/C 
and a Lot Morel AFS4922 

Worn., NW. WI. $1 
WC. AM/FM Cassano 
and More 50206446 0,950 

$1919 

New 03 Focus LX 4-Door 
ONE! a!  

$18,999 
t8.7.65-cL"•.°,14LIPA" Lamps,  

OIL CHANGES FOR LIFE! 
With the Purchase of Any New or Used Vehicle... Only at Pilot Point Ford!' 

LAST Olgg■$1 6;750 

POINTING THE WAY WITH BEST BUY PRE-OWNED VEHICLES! 
Trucks • Yon, • sport Utilities 

97 F350 4X4 Cab f Chauls 
Flat Bed, Powerstroke Diesel, Good Feeding Rig 
99 Ford F250 XLT Super Duty 
Reg. Cab, 2/WD, Auto, Only 590 
02 F150 SuperCab 
Snort/Wide Bed, Quicksilver, Auto, 03K. Sharp ,  
01 Ford SuperCab XLT Short/Wide Bed 
Buckets, Bed Cover, Anermarkel Wheels, 53K, A Steal 
02 Ford Explorer 4-Door, Very Nice with Only 50K 
02 Ford Explorer Sport Like New, Only 450 
01 F150 SuperCab XLT Short/Wide Bed 
Bnght Red & Ready! Local Trade, Only 41K, Chow 
00 F350 Cab I Clwule 2-Wheel Drive. Low Miles 
01 F150 SuperCrew 
2-WD. Dnven by I Lady. Only 66K. Nice!. 
99 Ford F250 /41.T Super Duty Crew Cab 
ShorVWide Bed, SO V8, 77K, Won't Last 
01 FISO XLT SuperCab Short/Wide Bed 
Nicest on Texas with Only 250 
99 F250 Crew Cab Super Duty 
Short/Wide Bed, 2/WD, Local Trade 
03 F150 SuperCab Short/Wide Bed 
Won't Last with Only 12K , 	 16,850 
96 Ford F350 Crew Cab Long Wheel Base, Single Wheel 
An XLT w/Powerstroke, Auto, Only 48K Almost New Miles!16,950 
01 F150 SuperCrew XLT 2.WO. XLT Package, Nice!....15,900 
01 F150 SuperCrew 2/WD, Only 15K, Hurry , 	16,995 
99 Ford F250 XLT SuperCab 424 Short/Wide Bed 
Powerstroke, Auto, Local Trade, Only 820 Won't Last.....98,995 
00 Ford Excunion Limited 
Powerstroke. 2/W0,1-Owner and Like New! .....................20,950 
03 F150 SuperCrew Lariat FX4 
5.4L118, Auto, Lots of Goodies 	 .....23,950 
03 Chevy Avalanche Z71 
CT Roof, Leather, Loaded. Only 3611! Shop this ...... .....24,950 

02 F350 XLT Crew Cab Dually 
Powerstroke, 2/W0, Only 480, On Sale for......... 	24,995 
01Ford F350 Crew Cab, Long Wheel Base, Single Wheel 
2/WD, XLT, Nice. Only 160 Local Non-Smoker 
Miles. Hurry,... 	 .26,750 
03 Ford Expedition XLT 4X4 3 Seats, Only 20K, Wow,26,850 
04 Ford F150 SuperCrew 5.4 V8, Auto, 20 in. Chromes, 
DVD Entertainment, Hand Bed Cover, Super Steed...........32,900 
03 F250 Lariat Crew Cab Super Duty 424 
73L Powerstroke, Auto, Short/Wde Bed, 
Local Trade with Only 191( 	 34,950 
03 F250 Crew Cab Lariat FX4 424 
6.0 Powerstroke, Auto. Local Trade with Only 7K, 
List over 545200, Own it Today for Just 	 35,500 

Sports Cars • Luxury Sedans 

02 Focus Bright Red with Only 26K, Only 	 6,950 
01 Taurus Power Sunroof, 36K, Alloys, Nice!.............. 	.7,950 
02 Ford Taurus Loaded, Only 44K, WOW! 	 8,750 
02 Ford Focus PAN, P/L, Tilt/Cruise. You Deserve 
99 Mercury Grand Marquis 
Local Trade. 730, Super Sharp 	 9,950 
03 Ford Taurus Nice Ca, with Only 291( Miles, 1P10357110,850 
02 Buick Century Special Ed. Leather, Chrome Wheels. 
Camage Root, No Expense Spared and Only 17K Miles! ..10,950 
00 Mustang GT Only 38K Wanna Have Some Fun? 	1,995 
01 Mustang GT Convertible Black & Tan, A Cool Ride.14,995 
02 Mustang GT 1-Owner, Auto, Local Trade, 
Bullet Wheels, Steel Gray and Only 11K Miles , 	17,950 
03 Lincoln Town Car Will Go Fast with Only 300.-e...23,950 
03 Cobra Black, Less that 1,000 Miles. Not for the Timid,31,950 

Chuck This OW! 

01 Honda C1112510 Dirt Bike Never Raced, 
Newer than New, Not One In Captnnty Newer! ......................2,950 
99 Chevy Tahoe LT 
White/Gold, Only 600 Actual, Hard Loaded and Extra CleanC4U: 

8,850 

11,750 

.....12,950 

0112,950 

12,999 

13,950 
13,950 

13,995 

14,850 

14,850 

94,950 

OPILOT 
POINT 	

www.pilotpointford.com  

940-686.2236 
Business 377 

Downtown Pilot Point 
On the Square 

4h 100 

Eddie Yetter 
Registered Representative 

Member NASD, MSRB, SIPC 
THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK 
Muenster Branch 
519 E. Division 	940-759-2218 

INVESTMENTS 

MUTUAL FUNDS 
IRAs .  

Cooke 
County's 
Favorite 

Since 1947 
"Haulin' The Hits" 
Your Texas Country Connection Since 1947 

1500 AM 	10 11-X 
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Os  Tracey Nichols to speak 
at First Baptist Church 

Four Compete in 
UIL piano contest 
Four piano students, 

Lauren Sepanski, Amy 
Nortman, Anne 
Walterscheid, and Jordan 
LaChance, traveled to 
Wichita Falls on Saturday, 
Feb. 7 to perform in a 
Region 2 UIL Piano 
Solo/Ensemble Contest held 
at Wichita Falls High 
School. They were 
accompanied by their 
parents and teacher, 
Rosemary Dankesreiter. 

Students were required to 
play selections from a UIL 
prescribed list with Levels 
of I, II, III difficulty, with I 
being most difficult. Lauren 
and Amy each played Level 
H, while Anne and Jordan 
performed Level III 
selections. 

Lauren Sepanski played 
Bach's "No. 1 Two-Part 
Invention" and received a I 
rating and a medal. Jordan 
LaChance performed 

Dankesreiter 

	

Alyson 	Grace 
Dankesreiter received the 
sacrament of Baptism on 
Sunday, Feb. 8, 2004 at 
Saint John Neumann 
Church in Lubbock. Alyson 
is the daughter of Tommy 
Joe and Sarah Dankesreiter 
of Lubbock. Serving as 
godparents were Alyson's 
uncle and aunt Eric and 
Cheramie Dankesreiter. The 
ceremony was performed by 
Deacon Richard Wood and 
the Bishop of the Diocese of 
Lubbock, the Most Rev. 
Placid° Rodriguez, CMF. 
Alyson was baptized by full 
emersion symbolizing Jesus 
Christ's dying and rising 
into new life. 

For her special day, 
Alyson wore a new 
baptismal gown given to her 
by her paternal 
grandparents. Alyson also 
received a cross necklace 
from her paternal 
grandparents, and a 
bracelet by her godparents 

Beethoven's Sonatina in G. 
He received a I rating and a 
medal. 

Anne Walterscheid played 
Prelude and Minuet from 
Octavio Pinto's "Children's 
Festival". Amy Nortman 
performed About Strange 
Lands and People and 
Curious Story from 
Schumann's "Scenes of 
Childhood". Anne and Amy 
each received a II rating. 

Official judge of the 
soloists praised these four 
students for their rhythmic 
precision, and musical 
techniques. He especially 
praised the students for 
their musicianship and 
dedication. 

Students have an 
opportunity to enter this 
UIL contest upon reaching 
seventh grade and acquiring 
the needed skills for 
competition. 

for the ceremony. 
Other family members 

attending the celebration 
were grandparents Tom and 
Debby Morgan, and Tom 
and 	Rosemary 
Dankesreiter; 	great- 
grandparents Norman and 
Aileen Butts; John, Dana, 
Anne, Sara, Abby, and Lora 
Walterscheid; and 
Benjamin, Kathryn, and 
Matthew Dankesreiter. 

After welcoming Alyson 
into the Catholic faith, 
guests gathered at Alyson's 
home and enjoyed a 
barbecue lunch with all the 
trimmings. A white cake 
inscribed "God Bless 
Alyson" and ice cream were 
also served. 

Unable to attend, but 
sending best wishes were 
great-grandmother Theresa 
Hermes; great-grandmother 
Irene Morgan; Zak, Amy, 
Erin, and Logan Struxness; 
Cameron Morgan; and 
Valerie Morgan. 

The Saint Jo Century 
Club is rustling up talent to 
perform at their first 
fundraising variety show, 
entitled Red River Review, 
to be held at the Saint Jo 
School Auditorium 
Saturday, April 3, at 7 p.m. 
Money raised from the show 
will fund Century Club 
community service projects, 
including the club's yearly 
scholarship awarded to 
Saint Jo High School 
graduates. 

Acts from all areas of 
entertainment are being 
sought to provide a fun-
filled evening of music and 
comedy. Bluegrass, country, 
pop, and instrumental 
music groups are welcome, 
as well as community 

Special events for 
February at Gainesville 
Convalescent Center 
included a music program 
by Bob Seal, John Kee, 
Gerald Mitchell, and Billy 
Rains on Tuesday, Feb. 10, 
and a concert by Fish Creek 
Ranch Boy Scout Troop 11,  

groups to provide comedy 
skits. 

Janis Sneed, Red River 
Review show coordinator 
and long-time Century Club 
member, said "We want to 
recruit about 20 'G' rated 
acts that are between three 
and five minutes long. We 
know we can put on a great 
variety show because there's 
an awful lot of talented folks 
in this area." 

Call 995-2103 for 
information. Performers, or 
a representative of the act, 
will attend a try-
out/orientation meeting at 
the Saint Jo School 
Auditorium on March 27 at 
2 p.m. and a run-through of 
the program on Friday, 
April 2, starting at 6 p.m. 

under the direction of Jane 
Austin, on Wednesday, Feb. 
11. They serenaded the 
residents with old time 
favorite love songs for 
Valentine's Day. 

Bill Wakeham and Shari 
Sears were selected as 
Valentine King and Queen 
at Gainesville Convalescent 
Center. They were 
presented with flowers, 
Valentine candy, and teddy 

The application deadline 
for the 2004 All American 
Scholar Program, sponsored 
by Catholic Life Insurance, 
is March 1, 2004. The 
program awards 20 non-
renewable college 
Scholarships in the amount 
of $1,000 each to graduating 
seniors who are Catholic 
Life Insurance members. 

The All American Scholar 
Program will be awarded to 
students whose academic 
achievement, leaderships 
skills, and community 
service set them apart from 
others. To be eligible, 
students must be a Catholic 
Life Insurance member at 
the time of application, be a 
graduating high school 
senior, and be enrolled in 
any private or public 

As many of you know, 
Tracey Nichols has been 
fighting a life-threatening 
battle with cancer, and, in 
fact a strong number of you 
have been praying for her. 
Well, God has been 
answering your prayers, 
and Tracey will be in the 
pulpit at First Baptist 
Church, 111 N. Pecan, in 
Muenster this Sunday, Feb. 
22 at 11:00 a.m. to share all 
that the Lord Jesus has 
done in her life. You are all 
Invited to come and listen as 
she shares her wonderful 

State GOP 
scholarship 

Republican Party of Texas 
Chairman Tina Benkiser 
will award one outstanding 
high school or college 
student a scholarship to 
serve as a convention page 
at the 2004 Republican 
National Convention, to be 
held at Madison Square 
Garden in New York City 
Aug. 30 - Sept. 2. 

The State GOP is 
currently accepting 
applications from students 
aged 18 to 20. 

"We hope to provide a 
positive learning experience 
for the outstanding young 
Texan who receives this 
scholarship," said Benkiser. 
"It will be an exciting 
opportunity to see the inner 
workings of a national 
convention, interact with 

bears dtiring the Valentine 
celebration. All residents 
received boxes of Valentine 
candy, cards, and heart 
necklaces. 

Valentine King and 
Queen for Gainesville 
Convalescent Center's 
Secured Unit were T.J. 
Richardson and Eddie 
Bernice Massey. They also 
received flowers, Valentine 
candy, and teddy bears. 

college, university, or trade 
school full time beginning in 
fall 2004. Scholarship 
selections will be based on 
community service, 
leadership skills, and 
academic achievement. The 
scholarship winners will be 
announced in May. 

Interested individuals 
may call the Catholic Life 
Communications Dept. at 
800-292-2548 or 210-828-
9921 for an application. All 
applications must be 
received by March 1. 

Founded in 1901, Catholic 
Life Insurance offers life 
insurance, IRAs, and 
retirement annuities to 
businesses and individuals 
living in Texas, Louisiana, 
Oklahoma, New Mexico, 
and Mississippi.  

testimony about the 
faithfulness and power of 
God. 

It is a documented, 
Verifiable fact that when 
people pray in Jesus' name, 
God answers, and the 
reason that answers come is 
that God is on His throne, 
and that Jesus Christ is the 
risen Messiah, otherwise 
there would be a deafening 
silence and nothing would 
change. He's Alive! Ya'll 
Come!" invites Pastor Bill 
Ledbetter (759-2772, 759-
4668). 

offers youth 
program 
national GOP leaders, and, 
of course, be present as 
President George W. Bush 
is nominated for reelection." 

Applicants will be judged 
on school achievements,'  
extra-curricular activities, 
and a 500 word essay on 
"The importance of young 
Texans being involved in 
the political process." 

The Republican Party of 
Texas will pay for airfare 
and a six-day stay at the 
Hotel Pennsylvania in New 
York City for the selected 
applicant. 

Complete details about 
the program and 
downloadable applicatioi 
form are available online at 
www.TexasGOP.org. The 
deadline for application is 
Friday, March 5. 

Mid Winter 
round-up 
reported at 
VFW meeting 

The Ladies Auxiliary 
VFW Post #6205 held theit 
regular meeting Feb. 16 in 
the Post Home. 

President Frances Bayer 
reported on the District I 
meeting at West Tawakini. 
Members participated in a 
candlelight memorial 
service for deceased 
members. 

Bayer also reported on the 
Mid Winter Roundup 
meeting in Austin, Jan. 22-
25. Wizard of Oz was the 
theme and officers were 
dressed as Dorothy, the Tin 
Man, and munchkins. A 
POW-MIA program was 
included in the candlelight 
memorial service. 

Sandy Hennigan made a 
Buddy Poppy display 
containing a Dalmatian 
puppy by a red buddy poppy 
fire hydrant that was taken 
to the Mid Winter Roundup 
meeting. 

Members were asked to 
bring a bear to the meeting 
to be given to the local 
police and local firemen. 

The opening prayer and 
pledge to the flag were led 
by Chaplain Hilda Sicking 
assisted by Conductress 
Linda Knabe and Patriotic 
Instructor Rose Marie 
Sicking pro tern. Roll call 
and minutes of the previous 
meeting were read by 
Secretary Ida Bindel. 

Get well cards were sent 
to two sick members. 
Frances Bayer served lunch 
to 11 members, and she won 
the door prize. 

The next Auxiliary 
meeting will be March 15 at 
8 p.m. in the Post Home. 

Bugs! invades 
Fort Worth's 
Omni Theater 

Giant bugs are preparing 
to invade Fort Worth! 
Bugs!, a large-format filM 
offering a bug's-eye view df 
the fascinating world df 
insects, will open Mar. 5, at 
the Fort Worth Museum of 
Science and History's Omni 
Theater. 

Bugs! takes you to the 
tropical rainforests of 
Southeast Asia, where 
predator meets prey in 
giant proportion. The filth 
stars Papilio, a butterfly, 
and Hierodula, a praying 
mantis, who live in an 
abandoned but by a river, 
surrounded by lush tropical 
foliage and a supporting 
cast of other intriguing and 
extraordinary insects. 

Along the way, you'll meet 
a host of other insects 
which, in various deceptive 
guises, also inhabit the rich, 
green, and humid world: 

See Bugs!, Pg. 6 

Anne Walterscheid. Jordan LaChance, Lauren Sepanskl, 
and Amy Nortman 	 Courtesy photo 

Saint Jo Century Club 
rustling talent for show 

Gainesville Convalescent 
celebrates Valentines Day 

Deadline approaches for All 
American Scholar Program 



Dr. Elaine Schilling and staff visited Sacred Heart Pre- school. 
Above, Hope Inglish sits patiently as she gets a dental check up 
from Dr. Schilling. 
Below, Leslie Eddieman shows Cody Dangeimayr now to brush 
Prone*/ 	 Deborah Wood photo 

FC C LA week celebrated 
in Feb. at NItienster High 

Abdominal Aortic Aneurysm Statistics: 
Thc mortality rate from a ruptured 	- 

I aneurysm is 90-95 percent, The mor: 

S. 	 
Lunch Menus 
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THE MI rNsIIR /!\ 11RPRIM School 
MISD board provides vision for Success 

:During the week of Feb. 
%13. the Muenster Chapter 

FCC1A tFamily, Career, 
atid Community Leaders of 
Manic& participated in the 
Mational FCCLA Week. 
This year's theme was 
"trlIrCIA: Follow Your Heart 
And BA Part Of FCCL.A. - 

 Throughout the week the 
students dressed according 
la the theme of the day. The 
students also participated in 
activities throughout the 
Week. 
,On Monday. it was Hat 

Day. The students also 
participated in a cooking 
contest_ In the Creative 
Cakes Category, Kristian 
Koesler received 1st place: 
in the Best Decorated Cake 
Category, Bridgette 
Element received 1st place. 
and in the Best Cookies 
Category, Leah Vinson 
received 1st as well. The In 
place winners received 
cooking utensils as prizes. 

Tuesday's activities 
included Teacher 

reciation Day. Traffic 
Safety Awareness Day. and 
Quiet Day. For Teacher 
Appreciation Day, the 
students cooked breakr. 
far the teas • - 7 • 

their 
ror aTre; 
Xwareness Day. the 
students met before school 
and passed out Smarties for 
tie 'smart' students who 
bizinkled-up while coming to 
sthcol. Those who did not 
bpckle-up received a dum-
tun sucker. And for Quiet 
Day. girls in FCCLA could 
niit talk to the boys far a 
*hale day. If a girl did, she 
bpd to give the boy her 

Jordan 
alterschead won the most 

hearts and received a giant 
dezoolate th* cookie for a 
game Ryan Fuhrmann and 
Russell Endres were the 
runner-ups and shared the 
siune prize_ 
: On Wednesday, it was 

Pajama Day FCCLA also 
tried something new where 
the StIkticallS particip.sted in 
the Beady. Set. Read: Day.' 
an FCCLA state proiect. It 
was a "Readathon" for the 
yOunger children who 
attend 	Muenster 
Elementary. Not only did 
the high school students 
read to the elementary 
children but the elementary 
children read to the hiFh 

students as we... 
Thursday In.,:"..uded Dress- 

1.."c 	Day 	and 	th, 

Of 	Luncheon 
where spaghetti, garlic 
bread, and green beans 
were served, followed by 
Texas Brag Cake for 
de&e. ert_ 

On Friday, it was 
Red/Pink Day and Campus 
Clean-Up Day. Campus 
Clean-Up Day has been 
chosen to pay tribute to 
those on the campus who 
work to keep the campus 
clean. The members also 
revealed their secret pals to 
whom they had been giving 
small rifts to brighten up 
their day throughout the 
week. Also, the organization 
elected Daniel Russell and 
John Sturm as this year's 
FCCLA sweethearts. 

FCCLA Week was a great 
success_ Now the students 
will begin to plan the 
Parent/Member Banquet 
which will.  be  held in May. 

I, Skasemu Gminueg 

WEEK OF FEB. • 2:-  
MUENSTER LSD 

- Tartu whneat and 
cheese, lettuce and 
tomatoes. spanish rice. 
beans, pineapple, brownies 
ieu-alnuts. 

Tuft:, - Chicken nuggets, 
creamed potato w/gravy, 
corn, mixed fruit, hot rolls. 

Wed. - Nachos:, tuna salad 
sandwich, lettuce and 
tomatoes. apples, cookies. 

Thurs. - Chicken fried 
steak, creamed potatoes 
w/gravy, green beans. 
bananas, hot rolls_ 

Fri. - Fish sandwich. 
lettuce and tomatoes, french 
fries, beans, applesauce, ice 
;Team 

SACRED HEART 
Mon - Cook's choice. 
Tues. - Lasagna. green 

beans, mixed fruit, garlic 
bread. 

Wed. - Tuna casserole. 
green peas. peaches. bread. 

Thurs. - Pork chops 
arpotatoes. carrots, baked 
apple slices, bread. 

Fri - Grilled cheese 
sand.w2:h t7mat -: soup. 

:=.-tc-kers 
LINDSAY LSD 

- 	Tacos 

Over 70 attended the 
Needs Assessment 
Committee Meeting last 
Thursday. Feb 12 at 
Muenster I S D 
Superintendent Clyde 
Steelman told the audience 
that three years ago five 
needs 	assessment 
committees 	made 
recommendations to the 
school board regarding 
academics, athletics, fine 
arts, vocational, and 
technology programs. After 
three years more than 90% 
of the recommendations 
have been implemented. 
Mr Steelman discussed the 
physical facilities and 
stressed the importance of 
not neglecting the physical 
facilities and grounds. 
These areas are sometimes 
overlooked and are then 
very. expensive to replace. 
repair. andor maintain. 

During the three years 
since recommendations 
were made to the school 
board regarding programs 
at Muenster ISD. the 
district and each campus 
continue to receive 
exemplary ratings from the 
Texas Education Agency 
■ TEA), the highest ranking 
a district or campus can 
receive from TEA. The high 
school was one of the only 
high schools in the state to 
receive additional academic 
acknowledgement from TEA 
in 2001 and was one of four 
to receive the  
acknowledgement in 2002. 
Also in 2002, Trios 
Monthly, named Muenster 
High School as one of the 
top ten high schools in the 
state of Texas and was 
chosen as a Texas Path 
Finder High School. This 
success is due to all 
,ducational stakeholders 
s,orking together for the 
,uccess of the entire 
educational program at 
Muenster ISD,' Steelman 
noted. 

Implemented committee 
recommendations included: 

Academic and Support 
- additional $25,000 added 
to the JH/HS science budget 
and an increase of l25' in  
supplies- . inixding=azitd 
increased budgets for I.TIL 
and TMSCA A science lab 
was added to the 
elementary campus. Four 
rooms used for storage in 
the old vocational wing/field 

Brie...Cont. from Pg. 5 

leaf cutter ants, which 
consume 20r1 of the 
rainforest's leaves; Rhino 
Beetles battling for the 
favors ol a female: ' 

and a colony of three million 
bats skitter across the 
screen, some magnified 
250,000 times their normal 

Bogs! will show at the 
Omni Theater Mar. 4 - Oct_ 
9, 2004. For show times, 
information, and advance 
tickets, call 817-255-9300, 
888-255-9300. or go to 
lov rtsgelunArg- 

pineapple, appiesauce, 
breatL 

Tues. - Vegetable beef 
soup, sandwich, lettuce, 
pickles. peanut butter 
brownie_ 

Wed. - Fish, macaroni and 
cheese, salad, peaches, 
bread. 

Thurs. - Chicken 
sandwich. french fries. 
lettuce, pickles, ice cream. 

Fri. - Cheese pizza, corn. 
salad, pears. bread_ 

ERA ISI) 
Mon. - Vegetable beef 

soup. grilled chet - 
sandwich, tossed sa 
sliced peaches rice kr,. . 
treat_ 

Tues. - Steak fingers or 
chicken nuggets. - 
potatoes, gravy 
salad, sliced pears. 

Wed. - Salisbury swag. or 
fish sticks, green beans, 
tossed salad, pineapple 
tidbiU, wacky cake_ 

Thurs. - Burritos, corn. 
tossed salad, strawberry 
ac,teesauce. chocolate chip 

Fri.- Pepperoni or cheese 
pizza, corn, fruit mix, ice 
CretUSL  

house area were vacated 
and remodeled for use as 
classrooms and learning 
labs were added to at all 
campuses. Seventeen Pre' 
Advanced Placement and 
Advanced Placement 
programs are now offered in 
junior high and high school 
with two-conference periods 
for secondary English 
teachers and the advanced 
math teacher. Early release 
on Mondays is used for staff 
development. A benefit 
package for staff members 
was added to keep highly 
qualified and exemplary 
staff members along with 
an additional one part-time 
and two full-tune teachers. 

Athletic - a vim floor 
cover, re-crowning the 
football field, a new HVAC 
system in the gym, old gym 
floor repairs, a new water 
cannon, re-alignment of the 
elementary PE program, 
replacement of roof over 
junior high gymnasium, 
hurdles (purchased by 
Muenster Booster Club and 
PTO), new pole vault 
standards and pits. an  
additional half-time 
coaching position, power-
lifting for boys/girls added, 
re-surfacing and curbing the 
track, an additional track 
runway for the jumping 
events, an increased budget. 

Vocational Programs 	' 
Family.  Consumer Science 
Vocational Agriculture 
Vocational ShopDrafting 

Extra-Curricular 
Athletics 

An 
Band 

and a new weight 
roomistorage room. 

Fine Arts ' for the band 
program an additional 
$2 5,0 0 0 	for 	band 
instruments, increased 
budget, new band uniforms. 
additional storage space 
added in the band hall, and 
changed class scheduling 
practices to keep band and 
other electives from 
conflicting. A qu.:11 , 1-1: 
theater arts teach, - 
hired -with Theater 
classes offered in junior 
high and high school, and 
the lighting system in the 
auditorium was upgraded 
with an added theater arts 
budget 

Danna Fredrick's kindergarten 
class had some early Valentines 
Day fun. At left. Zane Kemp 
decorates his Valentine cookie 
with sprinkles. lots of sprinkles. 
all by himself. 
Below, Mrs. Fredrick and one of 
the mothers help, from left. 
Abby Lutbner, Trevor Lancaster 
and Claire Schneider with their 
cookies. The kids had a fun day! 

Deborah Wood photo 

from community members, 
parents, staff members, and 
students is critical in 
providing a road map for 
success,' Steelman told the 
committee members. 
'During the last three years 
the district has seen Much 
success, which can be 
attributed to 
recommendations made by 
these committees and their 
willingness not only to look 
at the committee needs, but 
to keep in mind the whole 
educational program in 
order to continue success at 
Muenster ISD." 

$4,109 	$1,230 (42.72%) 
$18,835 	$14.835 (414.50%) 

$7,109 	$4,980 (233.91:) 

$65,475 	S16,225 (24.78%) 
$1,20() 	5200(16.67%) 

$21,004 	$3,000 (14.29%) 

$2,879 
$3,579 
42,129 

449.250 
$1,000 

418.000 

RELAY 
FOR LIFE 

Technology - additional 	After this information 
$50.000 added to purchase was 	presented. Mr. 
new computers and Steelman informed the 
upgrades, an Advanced committee members of their 
Placement class in responsibilities and the 
technolou, teacher training process in developing 
to include Intel, technology recommendations to present 
teachers to attend CISCO to the Board. Each 
Networking training, a committee consists of 
technology teacher added at community  members, 
the elementary school, Web- business leaders. parents, 
Mastering Page course staff members, students, 
added at the high school, and one board member. The 
and 60 new computers committees 	include 
purchased in December Academic/ 	Support. 
2003 with an increased Athletics, Facilities, Fine 
budget. Arts. Technology, and 

Vocational - adding Vocational. 
$2 9.7 5 0 to purchase 	'The Board's actions 
equipment for the during the past three years 
agriculture department and demonstrates that input 
an increased budget for 
supplies and materials. The 
Family Consumer Science 
program purchased new 
computers for design' classes 
and an increased budget for 
supplies and materials. The 
Computer Aided Drafting 
class received $15,000 to 
purchase new computers 
and an increased budget for 
supplies and materials. 

The following budget 
amounts include contract 
services, supplies. 
other/travel, and capitol 
outlay. Salaries are not 
included due to vast 
differences in pay as defined 
by years of experience. 

2001-2002 Budget 2003-2004 Budget Increase% 

June 4 & 5 

Gainesville High School - Leeper Stadium 

Amer i can Cancer Societ\ s 

2004 RELAY FOR LIFE k,  
of Cooke County 

RELAY 
FOR LIFE 

Attend the first 

TEAM CAPTAIN'S MEETING 
Thursday, February 26th at 6:00 PM 

Cooke County Electric Co-Op 
in hkens-ter 



• 
Sports 

Muenster Lady Hornets have 
"bland" Bi-District contest 
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Muenster Lady Hornets - Bi-District Champions, proudly 
show off their second gold basketball earned so far this 
season. Janie Hartman photo 

Three-way tie for District 
17-A to be decided in 
mini tournament 

Alisha Walterscheid ties the ball as Muenster's defensive 
pressure caused many turnovers. 	Janie Hartman photo 

Lady 
Hornets 

Vs 

North 
Hopkins 
Fri. Feb 20, 

7pm 
Howe H.S. 

Robyn Hermes (20) keeps a 
Lady Tiger from getting under 
the basket . Muenster's Lady 
Hornets brought home a 49-21 
bi-district victory over Bland 
Monday night 

Janie Hartman photo 

INVESTMENTS 
14% to 18% 

IRA Qualified 
State Regulated 

Principal Guaranteed 

Lynn Roberts 
(940) 825-6520 

I 24,A 

Bringing Good Things To Light 

You cannot define talent. 
All you can do is build the 
greenhouse and see if it 
grows. 	 W P 

HELPINGYOU is what we do best. 
John S. Bartush 

213 N. Main, Muenster 
940-759 -4052 

Hornets 
And 

Knights 

Fighting for 
playoff spots 

Thurs., Fri. and 
Saturday ? 

Era H S 

Metal Mart 

 

CHRIS BAYER 
STORE MANAGER 

3600 W. HWY. 82 
GAINESVILLE, TEXAS 76240 
940-665-8158 
800-677-2514 

FAX 940-665-3919 
www.metalmarts.com  

7(e S.e.tA.41c Zurdel ta Awe/tied P.,<demtusi Sad 2.,(449 

L---7 AN AMERICAN 

REVOLUTION 
2003 GMC Denali XL 

$9000 
Discount 

Stk# 214114 

2004 Buick LeSabre Limited 

2004 GMC Yukon SLT 

 

$9000 
Discount 

Stk# 103141 

Grill Ride 
Test drive a new 2004 GMC at Brown Motor Co and 
receive a $40.00 Gift Card for Nolan Ryan Steaks. 

See BMC for details 

Brown Motor Company, Inc. 
e 

GMC . Erefiniel 
We 	 rNe 

Monday-Friday 8:00-6:00 • Saturday 8:00-5:00 
1608 West Highway 82 • Gainesville, Texas 

940-665-5591 	wIrAv brownmotorco corn 	800-865-5591 
72 months W.A.C. thru DATCU w/10% cash or trade & 

It was a different kind of 
ball playing Monday night 
at Aubrey when Muenster's 
Lady Hornets challenged 
the Merritt-Bland Lady 
Tigers. Bland played a pass 
and dribble, kill-the-clock 
offense, in an attempt to 
keep the ball away from the 
Lady Hornets. Scoring had a 
late start, but after four 
quarters of play, Muenster 
took a 49-21 Bi-District 
Championship victory. 

Bland stalled away most 
of the 1st quarter, but 
Muenster's mid-court 
defense caused many 
turnovers, to keep the Lady 
Hornets in the game. 
Melinda Walteracheid 
scored the contest's first 
points two minutes into the 
game. JoAnna Felderhoff 
added 2 more two minutes 
later, with the Lady Tigers 
getting their first basket 
with 3:47 on the clock. 
Felderhoff then added 4 
more points and Alisha 
Walterscheid a 3 with 17 
seconds on the 1st quarter 
clock. The period ended with 
a 10-4 score. M. 
Walterscheid and Felderhoff 
each dropped in 5 points the 
2nd quarter for a 20-11 
halftime Muenster lead. 

Brooke Endres hit a 
basket just seconds into the 
2nd half. Felderhoff added a 
free throw, M. Walteracheid 
a basket, and another by 
Endres for a 27-11 score 
with 4:36 on the clock. 
Bland tried to stall, but 
turnovers and Muenster 
defense allowed the Lady 
Hornets to lengthen their 
lead. 

Bland scored a basket, 
but Muenster came back 
with shots by M. 
Walterscheid, Endres, and 
Felderhoff for a 33-13 score 
with 1:36 remaining in the 
3rd quarter. Bland managed 
4 points for a 33-17 score 
going into the final period. 

Felderhott dropped in a 
quick 2 points, then Bland 
hit a 3. Endres and 
Felderhoff extended the lead 
to 39-20. With 3:07 on the 
clock A. Walterscheid 
popped in a 3-pointer, M. 
Walterscheid followed with 
another 2, and A. 
Walteracheid 2 more with a 
trip to the line. M. 
Walterscheid rebounded the 
free shot and dropped in 2 
more points for a 48-20 
Lady Hornet lead with 1:12 
still on the clock. Both  

causing many turnovers and 
getting steals. 
M 10 10 13 16 49 
B 4 7 6 4 21 

The Lady Hornets 
advance to the Area 
playoffs, matched against 
North Hopkins of Sulphur 
Springs. North Hopkins 
took a big Bi-District win 
over Avery Tuesday night. 
The game will be played 
Friday, Feb. 20 at Howe 
High School. Action begins 
at 7 p.m. Muenster will be 
the visitors. 

District 17-A basketball 
did not end last Friday 
night in Muenster, as the 
Lindsay Knights defeated 
the Muenster Hornets to 
put the District in a three-
way tie that included the 
Slidell Greyhounds. All 
three teams have 6-2 
records and will use a mini-
tournament to determine 
the two teams that will 
advance in the playoffs. 

Muenster Coach Kenny 
Mann met with Lindsay and 
Slidell coaches Friday night 
to decide which team would 

$6000 
Discount 

Stk# 105783 

Felderhoff and Bland each 
hit a free throw the final 
seconds for the 49-21 Class 
A, Division I, Region III Bi-
District win for the Lady 
Hornets. 

JoAnna Felderhoff was 
high scorer in the game 
with 17 points. Melinda 
Walterscheid added 15, 
Brooke Endres 9, and Alisha 
Walterscheid 8. Muenster 
hit 10 of 17 free throws. 

Kallie Gerstberger, Robyn 
Hermes, and Tara 
Swirczynski all played 
outstanding 	defense . 

Kallie Gertsberger and Tara Swirczynski keep pace with a 
Lady Tiger ball carrier, as Bland tries to take time off the 
clock and the ball out of Muenster's possession. 

Janie Hartman photo 

get a first round bye. 
Muenster won the coin flip, 
ao Lindsay and Slidell 
played Thursday at the Era 
gym. The winner of 
Thursday's game will play 
Muenster Friday at 7 p.m. 
at Era. If Thursday's winner 
defeats Muenster, then 
Muenster will have to play 
the loser of round one on 
Saturday at 7 p.m. for the 
second place playoff spot. If 
Muenster wins their Friday 
game they advance as the 
first place team in the 
District. 



The Tigerettes had an easy win over CTC of Temple on Tuesday night. 71-17 was the final score. 

LOCAL NEWS • WEATHER • SPORTS 

6:20am, 7:20am, 12:20pm and 5:20pm 

Trade Fair • 9 - 10am, M-F 
940-872-2289 
Bowie, Texas 

The All NEW 

"The Greatest Hits 

of the 60's and 70's" 

NNW 
AM141 

r., 

.(111  

Big John Sturm pulls down a rebound against Lindsay. 
Defending Knights are Bradley Anderle and Clinton Kyle. 

Janie Hartman photo 

Central Texas Christian 
(CTC) of Temple had a long 
bus ride home Tuesday 
night after the Sacred Heart 
Tigerettes man-handled the 
Lady Lions at the Area 
playoff game. The Tigerettes 
clawed out a 71-17 victory to 
advance to the TAPPS 
Regional Playoff. We seem 
to continue to improve, 
commented Coach Jon 
LeBrasseur. This is a great 
defensive basketball team 
and our offense was at its 
best tonight." 

Jayne Biffle scored the 
first point of the game, with 
Jacqueline Bauer, Maggie 
Farrell, Courtney Hartman, 
and Biffle putting a total of 
25 points on the scoreboard 
the 1st quarter. CTC scored 
their first point of the game 
with 23.4 seconds on the 1st 
quarter clock for a 25-1 
score going into the 2nd 
period. 

The Muenster Hornets 
needed a win last Friday 
night to claim the 
basketball District 
Championship, but the 
Lindsay Knights had other 
plans. Muenster and Slidell 
led the District, with 
Lindsay in 3rd place. A win 
by the Knights would throw 
the three teams into a 
three-way tie for first. And 
that's what happened. 
Lindsay pulled out a 59-52 
victory over Muenster and 
now the teams will battle, 
with Slidell, for a playoff 
spot. (See related story). 

Muenster's gym was 
packed for Friday's game 
and everyone in the crowd 
got their money's worth in a 
hard-fought battle between 
the Hornets and the 
Knights. 

The Knights scored the 
first basket, but Muenster 
then put in 11 points before 
Lindsay scored again. 
Muenster had a 16-4 lead, 
then allowed the Knights 5 
straight points for a 16-9 1st 
quarter score. 

•With 4:44 on the 2nd 
qiiarter clock, Lindsay tied 
the game 17-17. Both teams 
lilt baskets with the game 
tied 23-23. A Trinity Otto 
wild throw at the buzzer 
was good for 3 and the 
Knights took a 26-23 lead 
into the locker room. 

•Muenster took the lead 
bick with 7:28 on the 3rd 
qiiarter clock, but Lindsay 
got a 6 point lead a minute 
later and kept a small lead 
until Russell Endres hit 
three free throws to tie the 
gime 37-37 with 3:46 on the 
clock. Lindsay would hit a 
basket, then Muenster, to 
tie the score. The 3rd 
quarter ended with the 
Knights ahead by 1 point, 
43-42. 

R. Endres scored the first 
point in the final period, but 
then Cody Anderle and 
Josey Kyle hit baskets for a 
49-44 Lindsay lead. Clint 
Miller and Sean Fuhrmann 
closed the score to 49-47 
with five minutes remaining 
in the game. Another 
Lindsay basket gave the 
Knights a 4 point lead and 
Lindsay began to work the 
clock. 

With 1:41 on the clock, 
Brandon Huckaby went to 
the line and made 2. 
Muenster missed their shot, 
Lindsay rebounded and-was 
fouled. Both throws didn't 
go, Muenster rebounded, 
missed two 3-pointer shots, 
and Lindsay inbounded the 
ball with 1:05 remaining in 
the game. C. Anderle was 
fouled and made a free 
throw for a 54-48 score. 
With 46.7 on the clock 
Endres hit a free throw, but 
Lindsay came back with 2 
points by Huckaby. A 3-
pointer by the Hornets with 
32.3 seconds on the clock 
closed the score to 56-52. A 
basket by Kyle, a missed 

The visitors scored 5 more 
points before the half, while 
the Tigerettes added 23, 
with Karen Gehrig, Bauer, 
Hartman, Biffle, and Farrell 
all hitting the basket for a 
48-6 halftime score. 

Sacred Heart slowed 
things down the 3rd quarter 
with Biffle, Gehrig, and 
Bauer each scoring 2, 
followed by points from 
Katie Flusche, Shannon 
Hartman, and Hannah Hess 
for a 59-9 score before the 
final quarter. 

The Tigerette bench 
players continued to control 
the game as Flusche, 
Stephanie Henscheid, 
Whitney Wimmer, Nicole 
Bayer, and Diana Knabe all 
got baskets while holding 
CTC to two 3-pointers and 
one 2-point shot for the final 
71-17 score. 

Everyone scored for 
Sacred Heart, led by Biffie's 

Muenster 3-pointer, and a 
foul gave Lindsay a 59-52 
lead with 13.6 remaining in 
the game. Muenster missed 
another 3-pointer and fouled 
Lindsay with 5.4 seconds 
left. After the rebound, the 
clock ticked down for a 
Lindsay victory over the 
Hornets. 

Russell Endres was the 
game's high scorer with 37 
points, which included five 
3-pointers and 12 free 
throws. Clint Miller added 
6, Derek Endres 3, Justin 
Wolf and Chase Cain 2 
apiece, and 1 each by Sean 
Fuhrmann and John Sturm. 

Knight scoring was led by 
Cody Anderle and Brandon 
Huckaby with 21 and 13 
points. Trinity Otto added 9, 
Josey Kyle 7, Cody Hess 4, 2 
apiece by Kristopher Creed 
and Clinton Kyle, and 1 
point by Bradley Anderle. 

Muenster hit 15 of 23 free 
throws, while Lindsay was 
six of 15. 
M 16 	7 19 10 52 
L 9 17 17 16 59 

Muenster Hornets John 
Fredrick (left) and Clint Miller 
get shots over Lindsay 
Knights Trinity Otto, Cody 
Anderle and Bradley Anderle. 

Janie Hartman photo 

17 points. Bauer added 14, 
Farrell 12, Gehrig 8, 
Henscheid 5, C. Hartman 3, 
Flusche 3, 2 apiece from 
Wimmer, Knabe, S. 
Hartman, and Bayer. Hess 
got a free throw. The 
Tigerettes hit 11 of 19 free 
throws. 

Defensively C. Hartman 
held CTC's leading scorer to 
one free throw the let half. 
Gehrig got four assists, 
three steals, and seven 
rebounds. 
SH 25 23 11 12 71 
er 1 5 3 8 17 

The TAPPS Regional 
Championship will be 
Saturday, Feb. 21 at TWU 
in Denton. The Tigerettes 
will face Midland Classical. 
Action begins at 9 a.m. 

Tigerettes 
Vs 

Midland 

Classical 
Sat. Feb. 21 

9am 
TWU, Denton 

The Tigerettes wait for the 
rebound in Area action 
Tuesday night against Central 
Texas Christian of Temple. 
The victory advances the 
Sacred Heart team to the 
regional round of the TAPPS 
playoffs. Deborah Wood photo 

(Warden's 
Report 

Never Underestimate a 
Warden — Howard and 
Midland county Game 
Wardens observed a couple 
of elderly gentlemen fishing 
and catching trout. When 
one warden approached the 
men and asked them how 
they were doing, one of the 
men stated, "Just fine," but 
he wasn't fishing. "I'm just 
helping my friend get this 
bird's nest out of his line." 
The warden told the 
gentlemen, "I bet your left 
hand not only smells like 
fish but will also have an 
evergreen scent on it too as 
you just caught a trout 
(using this rod) and threw it 
back at 4:45 p.m. and 
reached over and grabbed a 
branch of this tree right 
here (officer pointed to the 

, xact branch) and stripped 
your hand down it to get the 
slime off your hand." At this 
point the elderly gentleman 
gasped (with eyes and 
mouth wide open) and 
stated, "Holy moly. I'm in 
trouble'  t " I" 

Not Playing Games — A 
Hill County game warden 
assisted Texas Department 
of Public Safety Special 
Crimes, Texas Rangers, the 
FBI, and Bosque County 
Sheriffs Department with 
serving multiple search and 
arrest warrants at gambling 
rooms within Bosque 
County. There were nine 
establishments targeted. 
Six felony arrests were 
made and more than 
S26,000 seized in the 
operation. 

Opening 
Soon!!! 

TANS 
ON 

MAIN 
New Ownership! 

New Tanning Beds!! 
New Wolff Bulbs!!! 

For More Info. Contact 

Stephanie Schilling 
736-5386  • 

Sacred Heart 
swim team 
state meet 
results 

The State Swim Meet was 
held Feb. 13 and 14 at 
Texas A&M University in 
College Station. Fifty-six 
schools competed. Twenty-
six of these were in Division 
3 with Sacred Heart. Sacred 
Heart Boys Swim Team 
finished 3rd overall. Sacred 
Heart Girls Swim Team 
finished 5th overall. The 
Swim Team broke seven 
existing school records. 

EVENT RESULTS 
Girls 200-yard medley 

relay: Whitney Wimmer, 
Kimberly Hess, Kate 
Sepanski, Karen Gehrig, 4. 
They also set a new school 
record. 

Girls 	200-yard 
individual freestyle: 
Brittany White, 10; Paige 
White, 11; Melissa Thomas, 
12. 

Girls 	100-yard 
individual freestyle: 
Shannon Hartman, 16. 

Girls 200-yard freestyle 
relay: Jacqueline Bauer, 
Shannon Hartman, Karen 
Gehrig, Kate Sepanski, 3, 
brought home the bronze 
medal. They also set a new 
school record. 

Girls 	100-yard 
individual backstroke: 
Whitney Wimmer, 10. 

Girls 100-yard 
individual breaststroke: 
Joelle Fuhrmann, 7; 
Kimberly Hess, 8. 

Girls 1 meter diving: 
Joelle Fuhrmann, 3, 
brought home the bronze 
medal. She also set a new 
school record. 

Boys 	50-yard 
individual freestyle: 
Kevin Walterscheid, 5; Tony 
Koester, 10. 

Boys 	100-yard 
individual butterfly: Jon 
Ambrose, 6. 

Boys 	100-yard 
individual freestyle: 
Travis Hess, 7. 

Boys 200-yard freestyle 
relay: Mark Gehrig, Tony 
Koesler, Kevin 
Walterscheid, Travis Hess, 
3, brought home the bronze 
medal. They also set a new 
school record. 

Boys 	100-yard 
individual backstroke: 
Tony Koesler, 5. He also set 
a new school record. 

Boys 	100 	yard 
individual breaststroke: 
Travis Hess, 4. He also set a 
new school record. 

Kevin Walterscheid set a 
new school record in diving 
at the Regional meet, but 
did not compete in diving at 
the State meet. 

The senior members of 
the Swim Team are 
Kimberly Hess, Kate 
Sepanski, Karen Gehrig, 
Lisa Endres, Tony Koester, 
Kevin Walterscheid, and 
Travis Forshee (manager). 

The junior members 
include Jacqueline Bauer, 
Travis Hess, Jessica Knabe, 
and Melissa Thomas. 

The sophomore members 
are Whitney Wimmer, 
Shannon Hartman, Jon 
Ambrose, Neil Bayer, Mark 
Gehrig, Brittany White, 
Hannah Hess, and Joelle 
Fuhrmann. 

The freshman members 
are Paige White and Mark 
Fleitman (manager). 

Coaches are Jill Hess and 
Shirley Hess. 

Quotes 
You must believe to 
achieve. 

When you win, nothing 
hurts. 	Joe Namath 

PAGE 8 - FEBRUARY 20, 2004 - THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 

Tigerettes advance to TAPPS Regional Playoff 

Hornets kneel to Knights 

If 
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The Lady Knights defense keep Celeste away from the basket in bi-district action Tuesday 
night. Lindsay players pictured are, Cheryl Knabe (32), Brittany Anderle (33), Mallory Block 
(14), Lori Kasparak (23) and Whitney Neu (12). Janie Hartman photo 

Sacred Heart Regional swim 
meet results from Jan. 24 

(1 peg  

A E)  r?"\ -3T T A N 
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  ,\ r)  UNLIMITED 

J 	..JJ-LIJ TANNING 
FOR 7 4 1 

ONLY JJ 
or... "..; 

Or... -12 	1  

	

1 	UV Free 
Airbursh Tanning 

www.absolutetan net 	 Teo.. 

207 W. Broadway 
Gainesville, TX 

(940) 665-3513 

AUTO FRAMES 
BACK TO 

FACTORY SPECS! 
Our Unique Frame Rack can bring any Car or 

Truck frame back to manufacturer specifications! 

Specie,  lift 

Steven Knabe 

FULL SERVICE COLLISION CENTER 

Free Pickup and Delivery • Free Mobile Estimating . 

1115 N. Grand • Gainesville • 668-6857 

TEXAS STATE OPTICAL 
$99.00 

Frame & Plastic 
Lens 

Single Vision Only 

TRENDSPOTTER 
FRAMES 

METAL OR 
PLASTIC 

$119.00 
Frame & FT28 

Bifocal 
Plastic Lens Only 

Transition Plastic Len's Only 
Single Vision - $99.00 

FT28 Bifocal - $129.00 	Hacemos Examin para la 
Power Restrictions Apply 	Vista y para lentes contactor 

Servicio Completo en nusetro 
laboratorio 

Servicio entre una a dos horn 
(solamente de material de plasticol 

Therapeutic Optometrist 
	  - 

-No Doctor On Wed. 	 We Take VS. P. Insurance. 

We accept all doctors prescriptions. Offers can not to combined with my other coupons, discounts, insurance or sales. Some restrictions apply. 

(940) 668-7254 	• 	1-888-237-0756 
311 East California St.  •  Gainesville, TX 

Open M-F 9am  -  5:30pm  •  Sat 9am  -  1pm 

Full Surface Lab 
1-2 Hour Service 
Plastic Lens Only 

Dr. John Webb 0.D. 
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Lady Knights turn Blue Devils red 
"District Champs - you 

are?" and "Lindsay Who?" 
were signs posted at the Bi-
District game Tuesday night 

• by Celeste fans. After four 
quarters of play, the 
Lindsay Lady Knights gave 
their answer to the Blue 
Devils and their fans. An 
exciting, come-from-behind 
55-41 victory gave the Lady 
Knights the title of Bi-
District Champions. The 
Lady Knights' last such title 
was in 1996. 

Lindsay, District 17A 
Runner-up, met the District 
18A Champions at the 
Prosper gymnasium. Four 3-
pointers gave the Devils the 
lead in the 1st half, but 
Lindsay came out the 2nd 
half, outscoring Celeste 36-
17 to take the win. 

The Lady Knights took a 
4 point lead with baskets by 
Cheryl Knabe, but several 
minutes later, the Devils led 
7-4. Knabe got a 3rd basket 
and Celeste another 4 
points before the 1st quarter 
ended 11-6. 

Lori Kasparek made a 
quick 2 points for Lindsay, 
then Celeste added 3 before 
Allison Hundt closed the 
score to 14-10. The Devils 
took a 9 point lead as they  

added another 5 points. 
Whitney Neu dropped in 3 
points, Knabe 3, and Hundt 
1 to get within 2 points, 19-
17. Another 3-pointer by 
Celeste spread the score to 
5. Knabe got another 2, but 
Celeste came back with a 
bucket with 11 seconds on 
the clock to end the half 
with a 24-19 Celeste lead. 

Both teams scored 6 
points the first two minutes 
of the 2nd half. Then 
baskets by Knabe, Mallory 
Block, then Brittany 
Anderle gave Lindsay a 31-
30 lead with 3:32 on the 
clock. Kasparek added 
another 2 points before the 
Devils finally scored again. 
A score by Anderle at 15 
seconds gave the Lady 
Knights a 35-32 lead going 
into the final petiod. 

Celeste tied the game 
with a 3-pointer just 
seconds into the quarter. 
Anderle took back the lead, 
then Celeste tied it again 
37-37 with 5:27 remaining 
in the game. Anderle, 
Knabe, and Neu pulled 
Lindsay ahead 44-37 going 
under four minutes of play. 

Celeste scored 2, then 
Anderle 2. Then the Devils 
hit 1 point, then 2 by Knabe,  

1 each by Block and Neu to 
give Lindsay a 50-40 lead 
with 1:31 still on the clock. 
The Lady Knights weren't 
finished, as Knabe and Neu 
made trips to the free throw 
line to add the final touch of 
5 more points to the Bi-
District win. Celeste did get 
the last point, a free throw 
with 7.4 seconds on the 
clock. 

"I like excitement," Coach 
Donald Neu said to the 
Lady Knights after the 
game. "And we gave them 
an exciting game!" 

Cheryl Knabe was high 
point maker in the game 
with 18 points. Anderle 
added 13, with Kasparek 
and Neu each getting 8. 
Block put in 5, and Hundt 3 
for the Lady Knights. 
Lindsay hit 13 of 27 free 
throws, 10 in the final 
quarter. 
L 6 13 16 20 55 
C 11 13 	8 	9 41 

The Lady Knights will 
face McLeod this Satuiday 
night in Area playoff action. 
The game begins at 6 p.m. 
and will be played at Paris 
High School. 

Lindsay Lady Knights, Bi-District Champions, celebrated in 
the locker room after defeating the Celeste Lady Blue Devils 
Tuesday night, before lining up for a team picture. 

Janie Hartman photo 

Lady Knights 
win practice 
game Feb. 13 

On Jan. 24 the Sacred 
Heart Swim team traveled 
to Incarnate. Word 
University in San Antonio 
to compete in the Regional 
meet. Both the boys and 
girls teams finished second 
overall in Division 3 at the 
Regional meet. 

Division 3 is comprised of 
1A, 2A, and 3A TAPPS 
schools. There were 12 
Division 3 schools at the 
Regional meet. 

Of the 17 members of the 
Swim Team who competed 
at Regionals, 13 qualified to 
swim at State. 

EVENT RESULTS 
Girls 200-yard medley 

relay: Whitney Wimmer, 
Kimberly Hess, Kate 
Sepanski, Shannon 
Hartman, 2, State Qualifier 
(SQ) 

Girls 	200-yard 
individual freestyle: 
Brittany White, 3, SQ; Paige 
White, 4, SQ; Melissa 
Thomas, 5, SQ. 

Girls 	50-yard 
individual freestyle: Kate 
Sepanski, 5; Shannon 
Hartman, 6; Whitney 
Wimmer, 9; Paige White, 
10. 

Yellow 20 Red 28 
The 5-6 grade girls met on the 

Muenster ISD court Feb. 5 for an 
awesome game. Red came out 
strong and stayed ahead 
throughout the game, but Yellow 
never gave up and stayed right in 
the game. Scorers for the Red were 
Leah Smith with 9 points, Tiffany 
Teafatiller 8, Kristin LeBrosseur 7. 
and Victoria Endres and Briana 
Bindel 2 each. 

Lia Heers was tops for the 
Yellow with 10 points. Taylor 
Klement scored 6, and Jackie 
Klement and Cathy Aston both 
added 2. 

Yellow 24 Green 10 
On Feb. 9, 5-6 grade girls played 

at the Muenster ISD gym. High 
point scorer was Lia Heers with 12. 
followed by Taylor Klement 6, 
Jackie Klement 4, and Kelsey 
Pagel 2. 

Amanda Dangelmayr led the 
Green team with 6. Belem. Rohmer 
and Hayley Hess each added 2. 

Blue 20 Red 16 
The 1-2 grade Red team played 

the Blue team on Jan. 22. The kids 
played very hard and at times it 
got rough, but they all fought their 
way to the end of a very exciting 
game! 

Boys 	5 0 -yard 
individual freestyle: 
Kevin Walterscheid, 4, SQ; 
Tony Koesler, 5, SQ; Neil 
Bayer, 7. 

Girls 1 meter diving: 
Joelle Fuhrmann, 3, SQ; 
Jacqueline Bauer, 4; 
Hannah Hess, 5. 

Boys 1 meter diving: 
Kevin Walterscheid, 1 
(broke the existing school 
record); Neil Bayer, 2. 

Boys 100-yard 
individual butterfly: Jon 
Ambrose, 3, SQ. 

Girls 	100-yard 
individual freestyle: 
Shannon Hartman, 6, SQ• 
Jacqueline Bauer, 8; 
Brittany White, 9; Melissa 
Thomas, 10. 

Boys 	100-yard 
individual freestyle: 
Travis Hess, 4, SQ; Jon 
Ambrose, 6, SQ. 

Girls 200-yard freestyle 
relay: Jacqueline Bauer, 
Shannon Hartman, Whitney 
Wimmer, Kate Sepanski, 1, 
SQ. 

Boys 200-yard freestyle 
relay: Jon Ambrose, Tony 
Koesler, Kevin 
Walterscheid, Travis Hess, 
I, SQ. 

Eddie Sweeney was the leading 
scorer for the Red team with 6 
points. Close behind was Sydney 
Huchton with 4 points, and Jace 
Fredrick and Chance Herr both 
scored 2 points. 

For the Blue team, Brandon 
Hennigan and Mason Binder 
shared the high scorer position 
with 6 points each Zachary Pollard 
got 4 points, and 2 points each were 
Brianna Rohmer and Destin 
Fleitman. 

Blue 18 Gray 8 
The Blue team had several 

scorers, with Mason Binder leading 
the way with 12 points. Adding 2 
points each were Dentin Fleitman, 
Brandon Hennigan, and Darrell 
Hermes. • 

For the Gray team Clayton Hess 
and Garrett Miller both put in 4 
points. 

Blue 12 Green 10 
Both teams played great defense 

in a neck-and-neck game for the 1-
2 grades. 

The Green team's Isar 
Walterscheid hustled throughout 
the game, keeping his opponents 
from scoring. Also working hard on 
defense for the Green team were 
Shelby Sicking and Alyssa 
Schinigoi. Cole Walterscheid was 

Girls 	100-yard 
individual backstroke: 
Whitney Wimmer, 3, SQ; 
Lisa Endres, 5. 

Boys 	100-yard 
individual backstroke: 
Tony Koesler, 3, SQ. 

Girls 	100-yard 
individual breaststroke: 
Kimberly Hess, 2, SQ; Joelle 
Fuhrmann, 3, SQ. 

Boys 	100-yard 
individual breaststroke: 
Travis Hess, 3, SQ. 

Girls 400-yard freestyle 
relay: Kimberly Hess, 
Joelle Fuhrmann, Brittany 
White, Paige White, 3 

( 	
-,,, 

GAME WARDEN 
NOTES  

Game Warden to the 
Rescue — San Patricio 
County Game Warden 
Albert Flores recently used 
some of his training at a 
local Luby's Cafeteria. He 
performed the Heimlich 
maneuver on a woman who 
was choking. The maneuver 
was successful, and 
everyone went back to 
eating lunch. 

leading scorer for the Green with 
10 points. 

All eight players of the Blue 
team contributed to the win. Zach 
Pollard put in 2 points. Leading the 
way in scoring for the Blue team 
was Meson Binder with 10 points, 
two of which were free throws in 
the last seconds of the game to 
bring the Blue out of a tied ball 
game. 

Gray 12 Green 
The match between the 3-4 

grade girls was a good one. The 
Gray team's high scorer was Emily 
Hellman with 10 points. Taylor 
Endres added 2 points. 

Morgan Swank, Andi Felderhoff, 
and Caitlin Beavers all scored 2 
points each for the Green team. 

Green 34 Gray 22 
In last week's 5-6 grade girls 

Feb. 12 game, the Green team won 
34-22 over the Gray. Delana 
Rohmer was lead scorer for the 
Green with 12 points. Amanda 
Dangelmayr and Rebekah Hesse 
each scored 8, and Laura Sweeney 
6. 

High scorer for the Gray team 
was Shaine Felderhoff with a 
whopping 20 points. Lacey 
Trubenbach added 2. 

Lady 
Knights 

Vs 

McLeod 
Sat. Feb. 21 

6pm 
Paris HS 

Talking 
to your 
Turkey 
By Bob Foulkrod 

Your turkey calling 
should match or seek to 
alter a gobbler's mood. A 
hot, excited gobbler is best 
started with an imitation of 
a hot, excited hen, with a 
gradual tapering off. A less 
fired-up bird is generally 
also an initial candidate for 
some hot calling to see if 
you can get him more 
interested. With both, a 
lessening of aggressive 

calling is indicated as the 
gobbler closes in. 

When the gobbler 
comes right back to your 
call or, even better, "cuts 
you off' by gobbling while 
you are calling, you've 
gotten his attention and you 
may well get him. Usually 
when a gobbler starts 
heading your way he quits 
gobbling or gobbles less 
frequently. 

If you call at this 
time you are making him 
stop coming to respond and 
he may "hang-up," waiting 
for the "hen" to come to him. 
Wiser he gets in close, it's 
your turn to play hard to 
get. Call softly and 
infrequently to keep him 
interested and looking for 
you. 

Senior Lady Knight Whitney 
' Neu cuts a string of the net at 
the Prosper 	gym for a 
souvenir after 	Lindsay 
captured the bi-district title. 

Janie Hartman photo 

The Lindsay Lady. 
Knights had a pre-playoff 
practice game last Friday 
night in Muenster with' 
Dodd City. After four 
periods of close competition, 
the Lady Knights earned a 
49-45 victory. • 

Cheryl Knabe was high 
scorer in the match with 22 
points. Brittany Anderle 
added 16, with Lori 
Kasparek getting 4, Mallory 
Block 3, Whitney Neu 3, and 
Allison Hundt 1. Lindsay hit 
nine of 18 free throws. 
L 11 12 13 13 49 
DC 10 10 8 17 45 

Sports 	is 	the 	toy 
department of human life. 

Howard Cowell 

Muenster League Basketball 



CLASSIFIED WORD ADS 

ARE FREE! 
Applies t0 Individuals only 

Ono businesses or real estate. please). 

Ads  run  2 weeks free! I 
<JJA' !1  

Chrissy K000 & 
Chad Simmons 

210 N. Main Muenster 

759-4112 

 

l 	
 Services 1 

Retired CNA 
will care foe your elderly 

loved one m there home. 

Have mferences. 

Call Marilyn 995.2353 r 

Will do Fencing, Custom 

Cabinets and Home Repairs 

Call George 940-704-1856. 

940.995.9400. 	
r 

I 	
 

Automotive 1 
OVER 60 USED 
CARS AND TRUCKS 
available all the time at 
Holiday Chevrolet in 
Whitesboro. 888-8152 or 
(903) 684-3561. 

Services 
TENDER LOVING CARE 
Day 	Care 	Center. 
7584964. 	..x 

OTTO 
DOZER SERVICE_ 

Mike Otto 
665- 22 58 

Mobile 736-5333 

Neeo A HELPING HAND 

WITH YOUR SENIOR 

LOVED ONES? 
Will sit with your loved ones. 

make meals, tnps lobe 
doctor. Light housekeeping. 

Reasonable Rates. 
Please call Phyllis Fuhrmaen. 

cell (9031271-4016 oe 
home: 1940)736-2223. leave 

message 

For Sopuc Synleme 
ROEBIC K-37 
Septic Tank 

F^ Liquefier 
n 5, O9l5us 

dwaeam•swbr 
av aM a ŵranl..a 

enaev 	.less rue 

Community Lumber Co. 
200 E. Dlvlelon 

Muenster. 759.2248 

STATE INSPECTED 
eat processing plant 

Bring in yoar animal Tres or 
Thorn. Fischer'• Meat 
Market, 759.42U. 

` IJridal egistrry, i I 	
 

Political Announcements 
COUNTY  

COMMISSIONER 

Al Smith 
Republican 

County Commissioner 
Pct. 3 

154 M N. n. by N swab. 
PU &n 210. en. Trs., 71,275 

COUNTY  
COMMISSIONF,R 

Frank Rust 
Republican 

County Commissioner 
Pct. 3 

rrl MVd nn b, Fan, Nun. 

Vn m., vd, u.. r-.., 71,Iis 

SJIERIFF 
Michael E. (Mike) 

Compton 
Sheriff 

Prl. MN rte by Mehei r. 

(o qa.e. In11 PM VW1. 

r ae..dk u.a v,:a1 

CONSTABLE 

Terry Wayne 

Gilbert 

Republican 

Constable Pct. I 
Pd MN ruby Ten, Gilbert. loll, 

r Hey fI. O.lnerel1k. TO,. 71,240 

For Sale 	j 
FOR HOME DELIVERY OF 

Fort Worth Slap Telegram 
C.H DALE WHITE, 

940.880.27:3 

To Buy Avon x 
Call Loren Bayer 

759-5280 

1990 Yamaha ar 

Sunclassk Golf Cagy 
Gasohnc, hard rap 

w,ih p1. 	stole, , tarn. 

Ir,IdllVhr. In,l lillnf,i. 
I inrl 

DISTRICT JUDGE. 

Janelle M. 
Haverkamp 
Republican 

District Judge 
Pni. M P2 n,r by Mr. Ed F Mendy, 
C.r,eslgrToa.onr, ill lot Cher 

0.1., Wec. We Ku,.., bra, blob 

DISTRICT JUDGE. 

Ken King 
Republican 

District 
Judge 

Vol. MN lm by K.y, Snore King. 
C.r,r 5r 1,e4.5,0. PO au. 427 

:. ., Ib, Tru. 7v2a I 

DISTRICTATTORNRY 

Cindy Stormer 

District 
Attorney 

10"1 MN nn M  Mai P,r<II. 
aiyza T,w,n, II,? Elm Si 
C,.i .mk.Tralr, l4l 

DISTRICT ATTORNEY 

Roger L. White 
Republican 

District Attorney 
Pul MN Ica by Mqge R,bk, 

Whoa, C.aprlgn Tnaurr, PO Rr. 

For Sale   
AVON: 

T'n buy or sell Avon, 
call Evelyn Sicking, 

758-0368. 
	a lax 

For Sale or Rent: 
40 FI. Sloruge Conminer. 
Call Paul or Gary Hess 

/76576(11 

HANDMADE 
BASKETS 

Longahergerr 

1.151 FELDERIIOFF 
(940)759-2893 

Work (940) 759.4455 

Joy's Fabric Shop 

Close Out Sale• 
Saturday. Feb. 21 s0. 

Lost Day Open° 

50.80% OH Fahnc and 

Notions. On the square ul 

Seim Jo. 940.995-2390 

for special orders. 

'WeaIIhgselectioru for 

Kern )jeiter e r 
o&,4ael7litt 

Oor 
Da Lana EnaIres d' 

o6 err Tee! 
36' 

202 N. Man 	759-4455 

^ O 

Local Telephone 

Cable TV 

--- . (CNmupWar I Long Distance 

Internet 

Wireless Service 

Nortex 

^^^ Ka9isrrê  

J r,•1 Rio, f- 

roesiNR: 

& k 6ert /-d 

.rcr̂ seW^-+ 

r 
® 

aa
t̂r•i^ Ei e 

^euie[ry & ci/ i 

:n w. w1rt 	uv.n.L. 

759-2994 

 

For Rent 	1 
FOR RENT: HIGH PRES-
SURE Sprayer, 2500 lbs. 
For removing paint etc. 
Muenster Building Center, 
421 N 7-fain 719.2232 

Mini Storage 

.^ Schilling Fora 

759-2522 or 
759-2836 

Help Wanted 	1 
Someone to clean Sacred 

Hear Rectory and business 

offices on Tuesday. To apply 

call(940)759-2511,cn1. 17 

Full Time RN 
('all Laura Stoffely 

at Muenster 
ti1emorial Hospil;ll 

940-759-2271 

LOST 
Tn-colored Russell Hound 

Lost north of Muenster. 
Named Toby. Very friendly 

Please call Jay & Leslie. 
75'(.41)i(3, leave message. 

Ve titRke 
cD iie.c 

Lfl!fl[fl, 
 

Hay For Sale 
Paul & Suer Neuman 

759-2976 

PAUL J. HESS NO. I 
Kansas Alfalfa hay for 
sale. Any amount. 
805.7001 or 005-9228 7  

Pets 
ARC Lab Puppies 

Yellow & Black 
3 male. 3 female 
Parents on Mtc 

siesta, wormed, dew claws 
removed, vet checked. 

$200 each Call 759-5256, 

* H&H 
	* 

VACUUM SERVICE • SEPTIC TANK CLEANING 
PRESTIGE PORTABLES 
PORTABLE TOILET RENTALS 

* 940468.7288 • 940.738.3448 * 

HESSE-SCHNIEDERJAN 
HEATING AND AIR CONDITIONING 

® TRINE hi', Ilard To Slop A Tana 

Auh' Inurlmu„t ' ,Sheel Meld! • Hear Pwrips 

759.2787 	l'ACLA-OIO802C 	612 - 4328 

Le  •  al Notices 1 I 	  
NOTICE TO ('REDITORS 

Notice is hereby given that original Letters Testamentary for 
the Estate of Joseph B. Townsley. Deceased, were issued on 
Febmary 9. 2004, in Cause No 15753, pending In the County 
Court m Law, Cooke County, Texas, to David Wesley Townsley. 

All persons having claims against this Estate which is 
currently being adminisered are required to present Them to the 
undersigned within the time and in the manner prescribed by 
law 
do Davld Wesley Townsley 
1307 Whalry Drive 
Gainrsville, Trnas 76240 

Y1Uuvid Wesley' Todinfley 
DATED the 12,6 day 	Independent Executor of the Fslate 
of Febmaey. 2004 	of Joseph B. Townsley, Deceased 

NOTICE TO ('RFDITORS 

Nonce is hereby given Thal original Loners Testamentary for 
the Estate of John Lloyd Tucker, Sr., Deceased, were issued on 
Febmary 9. 2004. in Cause No. 15752 •  pending in the County 
Corn ai Law. Cooke County, Texas. to: Joyce Tucker Rigler. 

All persons having claims against this Estate which is 
rrendy being administered on required to present them to the 

undersigned within the time and In the manner prescnbed by 
law. 
c/o. Belvls R. Harris 
Altoettey a1 Law 

109W, California 

(;ainmvllle. Texas 76240 

DATED the nhh day 
of February, 2004 

fs/Belvm R. Hams 
AOomey for Estate 
State Bar No.: 09052000 
109W Califomia 
Gainesville, Tesas 76240 
Telephone: 19401665-3441 
Facsimile: (940)665-2000 

Serving Cooke, Wine, Denton 6 Montague Countlea 

a ^'RE/MAX First Realty 
• DelightYone Valeotlne with Dream Home laatioo. Came 

take a look at this 100' x 150'101 0111, deed rretnnions N 
Muenster 

• The Perfect Valeotinel Spend time oakyou

ai

r sweetheart at 
your 
vrva, i e  , oa iuegsod el ell twee in hetwee 

Go rgeous 
 3k. howe i r 

NW of Muenster m the MOD and in complete with guest 
cotage. Go lo. ywwf unnmeWnnoosfel cam to see a virtual 
lour. 

• Price Reduced on this 1 23 acre lot o Mue,ulee,, Colt for. 

•
W  
Wa

t nln 
rm Your Hands&Heart by theepl ot 	osemous 

3 br bnck home 1n Sluenster on a commer lot. Cell
oil 	d 

for details! 

Per more informarion en area propenier for sale, en to: 
w w w. ChristineWeinyapfel. tom  

Christine Beaulleu Weinzapfel 
BROKER ASSOCIATE 

MLS. 9401759-4749 

I  
	Real Estate 
	1 

House For Sale 
925 N. Cedar. Muenster 

3 bedroom, 2 bath, 

nice shop. Shown by 

appointment only. 

Call Adam 759-4815 

alter 6pm. 

Compennve Razes 
Ise National Bank 

a Salon Jo. 
Muenner Branch 

940-759.2218 

FREE 
Gaage Sale Signs 'Call 

Chnstine - RE/MAX First 
Realty. 940-7594749 ux  

House For Sale 
In Nocona 

208 Denison Si 
2 Bedroom. I bail 

chain link fence. 327,000. 
Call 940-9642474 

MOBILE HOME FOR 
RENT: 2 bedroom, a block 
from school on N. Walnut. 
Phone 769-2938, Jerome 
Pagel.  7 a a 

House For Sale 
3/2/2 wnarge living and 
kitchen areas Carpoo. 
large lot w/fence & 

sprinkler system. 
Great Location, 
Call 759-5202. 

RESIDENTIAL 
BUDDING Loeations are 
available in Community 
Estates, Lindsay, Texas, 
iocluding 25 platted 
locations, paved streets 
and underground utilitiee. 
For more information, 
contact 	Community 
Lumber 	Company, 
Muemter, 759-2218. 

178 acre Farm For 
Sale 

114 mole off IN 35 west on 

Road 2070. We reserve nght 

to refuse all bids 312 bnck 

home, fireplace. out 

buildings. Spends. pecan and 

apnvel Ones. School children 

picked up at door. Good 

water. Send bids to 

1012 CR 120, 

Muenster, TX 76252 

or call 940.736-2356. 
	 lrov 

1 BUY MORTGAGES, 
840.872.4543. 
	 ewx 

Muenster State Bank 
Does provide Compentave Rate & Low Closing Cost 

Home Loans & Home Equities 
WE ALSO MAKE Long-term Fixed-Rate Mortgages 

940-759-2257 

NORTH TL'XAS PROPERTIES 
.. .Sr,r107li,i,14C171.hjurrnter orrd snrrnnvee rin.n_' 

ONLY31,692 PER ACRE for 117.-Acres Near Red Riverand ONLY 
E MINUTES NW OF RUENSTES 10 mnlnes rat d Sant Jo Great Dee and 
taSty alea a aedtlileol 6400 61% reavty wooded 40% gal padlre b, 2 
ponds meal barn MN pens. 1I8 bold bean etcl4BMOppotrly hr bed MnB9. 
Homes in Saint Jo -$63,000 Sri, remodeled, noose re4y.3 881184 
$112,000 Lary Mme' lot news ymodekd Idchen and k7ng  mom 380784 

H5,000 

/'irlares, ertnpr, and derails on our er5.5itr( 
www.northtexasproperties.com  

or Call Jack at: 940.995-2987 

I 
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WHEN YOU NEED TO 

BUY, SELL, HIRE ... 

CLASSIFIED RATES 

First InserSon (26e per I Lord) mm $3.90 
Following Iris. (19e per word) min. $2.85 

Card of Thanks $8.00 ENTERPRISE 
CLASSIFIEDS 

940-759-4311 
OR FAx 759-4110 

DEADLINE WEDNESDAY NOON 

Sears Kenmore 

` 	Refrigerator 
Side by side w/Ice in door 

- Needs condensor mum, S'' ' 

Coil 995-2104 Son-Si' 

Nice Sofa 
Neutral cnlnrs 

Call for in6,  

Garage Sale 
Sal.,l,l , 

 Gaincwiir hint, ,J.d 
Cafe irons 

KI1111 I , ^ .'hill 

Choosing Internet software for your family 

Sakura's provides 
: (( writing you can feel" 

Embossed lettering used 
to require heat, powders, or 
'professional printing, but 
pow it's available at your 
fingertips with a new 
isroduct from Sakura of 
America , Glaze raised-ink 
;pens, 	providing 	an 
embossing feel to craft 

rojects and writing. 
,. Sticker accents, glass 
yascs - you can now add 3-D 

impact to almost any 
elastic, ceramic, and metal 
surface. Whereas most inks 
elide and run off smooth 
surfaces, Glaze thrives on 
nonporous materials. Want 
Yo write or decorate on a 
CD? Glaze works great. 
While Glaze requires a 
=anger drying time than 

lost pens , it works well for 
(he patient crafter on non- 
porous 	surfaces 	like 
wideocent mylar. 
Wedding invitations, gift 

lards, handmade stationery, 
bltered books ---besides 
providing tactile sensation, 
laze'a texture gives your 
rojects emotional depth as 

well. 
Write or draw with Clear 

Glaze---then reveal birthday 
wishes or other secret 
messages by sponging color 
over the surface. Water-
resistant Glaze acts like a 
"resist" to create the look of 
batik. Let your creativity 
and imagination discover 
the many dimensions of 
Glaze. 

Glaze colors come out 
bright, 	glossy, 	and 
iridescent and will brighten 
up 	any 	craft, 
rubberstamping, 	or 
pe ercraft project. 
Blaze pens come in gloss 

orange , gloss pink, gloss 
purple, gloss blue, gloss 
yellow, gloss red, gloss rose, 
gloss green , gloss black, and 
gloss clear. 
Applications: 
• Ceramic and glass accents 
• Rubberstamping 
Flourishes 
• Sticker embellishments 
• Wedding invitations 
• Card making and 
bookmark texture 
• Write on CDs 
• Batik effects 
• Anywhere 3-D texture is 
wished 

Parents are quickly 
becoming aware that 
Internet Safety is an 
important issue to deal 
with. However, many don't 
know what the first step is, 
or what type of software 
products are even available. 
Sometimes the range of 
choices can be 
overwhelming. However, it 
is our # lpriority at 
Software4Parents.com  to 
help You choose a great 
product to keep your 
children safe online! 

There are two main types 
of Internet Safety software: 
Monitoring software 

This is software that lets 
Parents see everything their 
kids are doing online. It can 
be installed either totally 
invisible or in a mode that 
warns children that they 
are being watched. 
Monitoring software can 
record every single email, 
instant message, chat 
session, website, and even 
children's passwords. 

Filtering software - This 
is software that blocks kids 
from inappropriate websites 
such as pornography, hate, 
violence, or generally any 
other topic a parent does 
not want their child to see. 
It 	is 	usually 	quite 
customizable (parent can 
add words/phrases that 
interest them) and also has 
some 	supplemental 
features: the ability to limit 
the amount of time kids 
spend online, privacy falters 
that can prevent a child 

from revealing their name, 
address, phone, or any other 
personal detail, etc. 

Once you decide if you are 
more interested in 
MONITORING or 
FILTERING, the next step 
is which specific product is 
best for your needs. 

MONITORING 
PRODUCTS 

Our #1 recommendation 
for monitoring software is 
Spector PRO. It recently 
won PC Magazine Editor's 
Choice for "Activity 
Monitoring" and is by far 
the easiest, most reliable, 
and best-supported package 
we sell. It is also our #1 
seller. It captures ALL 
instant messages, ALL 
email (including Hotmail 
and Yahoo mail) all 
websites, keystrokes, and 
more. 

However, to view what 
has been recorded with 
Spector PRO, a parent must 
sit down at the computer to 
access it. 

For parents who may 
work late or travel a lot, 
a REMOTE MONITORING 
solution may be best. 
eBlaster is similar in 
features to Spector PRO, 
but will EMAIL you the 
recorded information 
remotely. That way, if your 
child comes home from 
school and you are still 
working, you can set it to 
email you exactly what they 
are doing while you are at 
work , eBlaster is also a very 
reliable product 	and 

includes live phone support, 
just like Spector PRO. 

Last is our best value-
monitoringackage: 
IamBigBrother. It includes 
most of the same features as 
Spector PRO, but only has 
email based tech support 
available. This product is 
best for people who are 

	

somewhat 	computer 

	

familiar, 	and 	are 
comfortable downloading 
and installing software with 
limited tech support. 
FILTERING PRODUCTS 

Our #1 recommendation 
for filtering is Cyber 
Sentinel. It is based on 
words and phrases that are 
totally customizable, but 
also the context in which 
these are used. The 
software is very easy to use 
and flexible, and includes 
live phone support. 

	

Features 	include: 
web/email/chat blocking, 
time limitations , privacy 
filters and more One 
limitation is that you can 
only set up a "master" 
profile - not separate 
preferences for different 
children. 

For parents with children 
of different ages, Net Nanny 
may be a good choice. It is 
similar in features to Cyber 
Sentinel, but you can set up 
specific preferences for each 
child who uses the Internet 
in your home. That way, 
you can be more flexible 
with a 16-year old, but more 
restrictive with an 11-year 
old. Please onte that Net 

Nanny is NOT for AOL 
users! 

Lastly, we have Cyber 
Patrol - our most expensive 
product. Cyber Patrol is 
licensed on a yearly 
basis., all other products are 
a one time fee only. Cyber 
Patrol has similar features-  
but is even more powerful 
as it allows various 
categories of content to be, 
blocked or unblocked. 

Overall, choosing a safety 
product can seem like a 
tough task, but with the 
right experts and advice, it 
does not have to be. Pleas 
feel free to email us with 
questions specific to YOUR 
family! 
Resource: Joshua Finer, 

Internet Safety expert and 
CEO of 
Software4Parents.com  -
Please feel free to email us 
at 
support@softw a re4parents.c 
qql for help choosing! 

National Weather 
Service language 
Heavy snow - a 

snowfall, 	which 
accumulates to a depth of 
at least 4 inches an 12 
hours or 6 inches in 24 
hours. 

Preparing your' 
home for winter 

Keep extra medicine 
baby items and first-aid 
supplies on hand. 

IN STOCK 
Electrical - Plumbing 
Paneling - Roofing 

Hardware - Water Pumps 
Heating  -  Air Conditioning 

We can recommend an installer 
Muenster Building 

, s.,•  Center, Inc. 
r 	Muenster, 759-2232 



Farm &  Ranch 
Consumers key to beef recovery 

County Agent's Report CEA.- AG/NR 
Wayne Becker ' 

The Muenster area was a winter wonderland Saturday after snow covered the ground. The 
season quickly change, as temperatures on Wednesday reached the mid-60's. The moisture 
from the snow was greatly welcomed, as the area Is still well below the needed water level. 

Janie Madman photo 

Only you can prevent a 
forest fire, but if you have a 
crowded pine forest, you 
might want to start one -
carefully. "When fire is 
good," on page 26 in the 
Feb. issue of Progressive 
Farmer, explores the safe 
way to improve your pine 
tree stands. Foresters 
recommend that you 
perform controlled burns 
when pines are at least 15 
feet tall and branches are at 
least nine feet from the 
ground. Here are some of 
the benefits of burning: 

• Returning valuable 
nutrients to the soil. 

• Controlling woody 
plants that compete with 
pines and could fuel 
damaging fires. 

Ag Facts 
19% of Americans prefer 

cheese as a food gift over 
candy, preferred by 13%. 

There are 1 million food 
producers in the world 
compared to 6.2 billion 
people. 

Talk 'til you drop sale! 
with Cingular Natiorf and Mobile to Mobile 

Get a FREE Phone* 
Noloa 3595 GSM 	 Sign up on our 
with COLOR Screen 	Cingular GSM Natiorf Plan 

FREE' 	 for 

99 
per month 

Includes: 

600 

5000 
5000 Nuiiighbs & weekend 

Otno mtatly c..51= 
See 1.13. 

$49 

940-665-3347 lignex 2200 E. Hwy 82 	 cingular 
bes1 

Nan* 

-01,..1....11000.., els, Wmplom fa. leb t ,  e fe, As me ran. n cen0Ing 
telpsleis velem, engame se .0 folors.loaW./ces nceps Mrirpl. on/9.f. 

NO.. • • • I • I am, Ile .7.1o7Cos Rex, 
wile.co Me mon,. me m Webb nsta 13....1■11.7 

aft Onpar paw nrnberia, 	 ina(104.Impialt.49/ carp prs 	 1.12 •••I Mae 

chin WM • astrn• Dana... PAM. ono .11maad uspo an qr... re rtm 0.4 
Smeary um.. Ye 	 Onw 

wee  Se......aet 

C----Xtn■rims• Gainesville, TX 76240 

Texas State Highway Department began in 1917. The 
construction of the first road was in 1918, a 20 mile 
stretch in Brooks County between Falfurrias and 
Encino. It was completed in 1920. 

The Texas Department of Transportation maintains 
more than 79,000 miles of road.  

(940) 665-4367 	Website: www.gainesvillelivelock.com  
Lighl NcIght NIccra a, Hole, - - SI CIO to 52.00 HIGHER. 500.700 lh Steers 52 	r 
55.00 HIGHER 500-700 lb. Heifers -- STEADY 700-900 16 Steers & Heifers 5' 	• 
53.00 LOWER. Packer Cows & Bulls -- $2.00 to 53.00 HIGHER. Parrs & Bred I 
STEADY. Sold at Friday's sale were SIB compared to 545 head of cattle the previous ..., 
Tuesday, February 17. the market conducted the sale of 253 Goats. 89 Sheep. and 197 Hugs 
The numbers horn last week were 175 Goats. 78 Sheep. and 97 Hogs respectively. Results of 
both sake follow: 
Feeder Steers (per 16) 	Stocker Cows (per head) 	Ewes (per lb.) 

200-300 lbs.: No. I. 	Pregnancy-tested. 3 to Stocker, 55-.70; Thin..40- 
15-1 28: Nos. 2 & 3..95 - 9-year-olds - Large Frame, .55; Fai..50-65. 
15; 300-400 lbs.: N. I, 5600-S710; 	Medium 	Bucks (per lb.) 
15-1.27; Nos. 2 & 	Frame. 5400-5600. 	 Fat. 50.57 
15, 400-500 lbs.: No I. 	Cow/Calf Pairs wkalves 	Barbados (per head) 
05-1.24: Nos. 2 & 3..90- under 250 lbs. 	Large Lambs: 525-559 Ewes 
05; 500-600 lbs.: No. I, Frame. 	5800-S950: $30-570. Bucks: 550-5165 

94-1.10; Nos. 2 & 3..80- Medium Frame, 5640- 	Goats (per head) 
94; 600-700 lbs., No. I. 5800. 	 Kids: 20-35 lbs.. 521 - 5 9 1i 

88- 1.00. Nos. 2 & 3, 77. Holstein Baby Calves. 35-55 lbs.. 530-565 " 
88; 700-800 lbs, No I, 555-5100: Crossbreds. lbs .350-$75.Yearling , 

 80-.83; Nos. 2 & 3, .65-.80. S140-5220. 120 lbs.. S85-5120. 
Feeder Heifers (per lb.) Barrows & Gilts (per 16) 	Nannies (per head) 

200-300 lbs., No. I. 1.10- US 41, 230.270.40-.44: 	Stocker.$60-575: Milk 
1.18; Nos 2 & 3, 100-1.10, US #2, 220-280..35-49 	Type: 545-S75: Slaughter 
500-400 lbs.. No. I. 1.10- 	Feeders (per head): 	Thin. 540-555, Fat. $70- 
1.17; Nos 2 & 	 100.175 lbs.. $30.$55; 	590. 
400-500 lbs.: No 1..98- 23.90 lbs.. 5750-530. 	Billies (per head) 
1.15; Nos. 2 & 3..80-98; Sows (per lb.) 12011s-up 
500-600 lbs.: No. 1.10- 14: Feeder. 400 or less. 15-.30, Breeders. $90.5115: 
No, 2 & 3. 80-90: 600. Light wt.. 400-500. .25-.27; Slaughters. S75-$125. 
700 lbs.: No I. 81-.85. Med. wt. 500-600..25-.28; 	Boer Goats (per head) 
Nos. 2 & 3. .75 -  .8 1, 700- Heavy wt., 600+..26-.28. 	1/2 Nanny. 575-5 100.  
800 lbs.: No 	.73-.81. 	Boars: (per lb.) 	3/4 Nanny. 875.5120. 
Nos. 2 & 3..50 -.73. 	30016. -up..02-.07; 	Full Nanny. 575.5230. 
Slaughter Glide (per Id) 200-3001bs...07-.15; 	 Boer Goats 
Slaughter Bulls: Yield Light wt...20-.25. 	 (per head) 
Grade 1-2. 1.200-2.05016s.. Sheep (per lb.) 1/2 Billy, NT: 3/4 Billy. 
60-.69. Slaughter Cows: Feeder lambs: 40-60 lbs.. NT Full Billy. S60-5250 

41 - 3 .18- 4-150 NT. Light lambs 0010 

. ■ 4 ■ 	 N , 	 I 

1 

(940) 665-4367 
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Controlled burns may 
prevent a larger danger 

The extent to which 
consumers continue buying 
beef after the Dec. 23 
announcement that bovine 
spong.iform encephalopathy 
(BSE) has been found in a 
single cow in Washington 
state is vital to the beef 
industry's recovery from the 
setback. 

Because the United 
States exports only about 10 
percent of its beef 
production, U.S. consumers' 
willingness to eat through 
the other 90 percent of 
domestic beef production 
will be important in 
sustaining the beef industry 
over the next few months, 
when exports will be 
practically zero. 

Recognizing the  
importance of consumer 
confidence to the industry's 
survival, American Farm 
Bureau Federation 
President Bob Stallman 
issued a statement on the 
day the BSE finding was 
announced encouraging 
American consumers to 
keep eating U.S. beef. 

"The isolated detection of 
BSE today in Washington 
state may be troubling to 
American consumers; 
however, they should be 
reassured that the overall 
safety of our food supply is 
not in question," he said. 

"Overall, beef remains a 
safe choice for consumption. 
Americans should continue 
eating beef. I know I will," 
he added. 

More than 30 countries 
have responded to the BSE 
finding by closing their 
borders to all U.S. beef. 
Three of the four top 
markets for U.S. beef 
exports, Japan, South Korea 
and Mexico, have banned 
U.S. beef. The fourth, 
Canada, continues to allow 
imports of beef from U.S. 
cattle less than 30 months 
old. 

Beef exports in 2002 were 
valued at $3.2 billion, and 
were expected to exceed 
that amount in 2003. 

The United States 
resumed importing beef 
from Canadian cattle 30 
months or younger just six 
months after the discovery 
of a BSE-affected cow in 
Canada last May. If other 
countries resume accepting 
U.S. beef just as quickly, 
price declines could be 
around $5 per  
hundredweight, according 
to Terry Francl, an AFBF 
senior economist, rather 
than $10 if major importers 
still refuse U.S. beef 
throughout much of the 
second half of the year. 

The 	Agriculture 
Department's investigation 
of the cow in Washington 
state revealed it was born in 
April 1997, before the Food 
and Drug Administration in 
August of that year 
implemented a ban on 
feeding ruminant meat-and-
bone meal to cattle and 
other ruminants. 

The 	department's 
investigation also suggested 
the cow was imported into 
the United States from 
Alberta, Canada, along with 
81 other head of cattle, in 
2001. The department is 
trying to track down the 
other members of the 
imported herd. 

The 	Office 	of 
International Epizootirs, an 
international organization 

- that tracks countries' 
animal health status, still 
considers a country BSE-
free if all cases of the 
disease have been clearly 
demonstrated to originate 
directly from the 
importation of live cattle, 
and the affected cattle as 
well as any calves born at 
least two years prior to the 
onset of the disease have 
been slaughtered and 
completely destroyed. 

Some of the decline in 
U.S. export sales should be 
offset by lower imports of 
beef into the United States, 
according to Francl. Under 
normal circumstances, the 
United States would import 
about 600 million pounds of 
beef, or about 46 million 
pounds per week, during 
the first quarter of 2004. 

"While export sales are 
likely to drop to near zero 
over the next six months, 
some of this decline will be 
'offset by lower imports of 
beef into the United States, 
perhaps up to one-fourth 
the total or about 150 
million pounds in the first 
quarter," Francl estimated.  

"So the net drop in 
consumption will be around 
450 million pounds for the 
quarter, or 35 million 
pounds per week." 

That translates into a 
cash price decline of $10.50 
per hundredweight, 
according to Francl. He 
thinks that for each one-
million-pound drop in 
weekly demand, prices will 
decline 30 cents per 
hundredweight. 

In early December, before 
the BSE case was 
discovered, live cattle 
futures peaked at just about 
$100 per hundredweight. 
Since then, they have fallen 
to $75 per hundredweight. 
However, short-term prices 
are likely to be more volatile 
than price changes over the 
coming weeks and months. 

Agriculture Secretary 
Ann Veneman announced 
additional steps Dec. 30 to 
further decrease any chance 
that meat from BSE-
affected cattle makes it into 
the food supply. It is hoped 
the regulatory changes will 
boost consumer confidence 
as well as that of U.S. 
trading partners. 

The department is taking 
six new steps: 

* Effective 
immediately, all downer 
cattle are banned from the 
human food chain. 

* Cattle tested for 
BSE will be held, and 
marked "inspected and 
passed" only after test 
results confirm the animals 
do not have BSE. 

* The parts of an 
animal considered "specified 
risk 	material," 	thus 
prohibiting their use in the 
human food supply, is 
expanded to include the 
skull, brain, trigeminal 
ganglia (nerve cells), eyes, 
vertebral column, spinal 
cord and dorsal root ganglia 
of cattle over 30 months old, 
as well as the small 
intestine of cattle of all 
ages. Tonsils from all cattle 
are already considered 
inedible ana do not enter 
the food supioly. 

* The 	current 
prohibition on including 
spinal cord in products 
labeled as meat is expanded 
to also include dorsal root 
ganglia. This is to ensure 
that 	muscle 	tissue 
separated from the bone 
under high pressure, a 
system called Advanced 
Meat Recovery, does not 
include parts of the spinal 
cord or nerve cells. 
Advanced Meat Recovery 
entails using special 
equipment to trim from the 
bone any small meat 
fragments left behind 
during prior processing. 

a 	The practice of 
using air injection to stun 
cattle before slaughter is 
banned in order to ensure 
that portions of the brain 
are not dislocated into other 
tissues of the carcass. 

* Use of mechanically 
separated meat in human 
food is prohibited. The 
concern is that the 
equipment used in this 
process could crush the bone 
and make it easier for bone 
fragments to wind up in 
meat. 

Veneman said the policy 
changes had been under 
consideration for several 
months, especially since the 
finding of the BSE case in 
Canada last May. 

The 	omnibus 
appropriations' bill the 
Senate will consider soon 
after it returns from the 
holiday recess includes 
language banning downed 
animals from the food 
supply. Farm Bureau did 
not support the legislation. 
however, AFBF policy 
opposes transporting non-
ambulatory animals from 
the farm to a processing 
facility. 

In addition, Veneman 
announced that the 
department i s 
implementing a verifiable 
system of animal 
identification to speed 
tracing an animal's origins 
and identifying any other 
animals with which it may 
have had contact. BSE is 
not contagious, but the 
conditions that lead to a 
BSE case could also affect 
other members of the herd. 
The livestock industry and 
state and federal 
governments have been 
cooperating for more than a 
year to develop a voluntary 
U.S. Animal Identification 

Plan (USAIP). 
Under the USAIP, al I 

states would have . ■ 

premises identification 
system in place by this July, 
and all animals covered 
under the plan would have 
a form of identification, 
probably an electronic ear 
tag, by July 2006. 

The cow found to have 
BSE was six and a half 
years old and lived on a 
dairy farm in Mabton, 
Wash., about 40 miles 
southeast of Yakima. The 
entire herd is under state 
quarantine, and USDA 
plans to test any animals 
that die on the farm for 
signs of BSE. 

BSE is a fatal brain 
wasting disease of cattle. It 
is thought to be caused by 
feeding neural tissue, such 
as the brain or spinal Ford, 
from BSE-affected animals. 
The human form of BSE, 
new variant Creutzfeldt-
Jakob disease, is also 
thought to come from eating 
neural tissue from BSE-
affected cattle. 

The BSE case in 
Washington state, the first 
ever in the United States, 
was found as part of 
USDA's routine testing of 
non-ambulatory cattle. 

Farm 
Service 
Agency 
News 

CONSERVATION 
PROGRAM SIGN-UP- 

EQIP 
Natural 	Resources 

Conservation Service 
(NRCS) has announced the 
2004  sign-up for 
conservation practices that 
will be implemented in 2005 
in Cooke County. Cost 
shares will be offered at 
50% of cost. The application 
period starts now and runs 
through April 16. 

Due to limited funding 
only high priority practices 
that solve an erosion 
problem will be looked at. 
The practices in order of 
priority are: 

1. Planting permanent 
grass on highly erodible 
cropland currently being 
cropped. 

2. Planting permanent 
grass on non-highly erodible 
cropland currently being 
cropped. 

3. Shaping and planting 
permanent grass on 
waterways and constructing 
terrace systems on land 
currently being cropped. 

4. Planting permanent 
grass on abandoned 
cropland. 

5. Planting permanent 
grass on field borders and 
filter strips. 

To sign-up, please call 
NRCS and make an 
appointment: (940)668-7794 
ext. 3. 

SECOND ANNUAL 
FARMER AND 

RANCHER SYMP - 
5.5 CEU's 

Wednesday, Feb. 25, at 
NCTC Little Theater, 
producers will have the 
opportunity to acquire more 
CEU's. The education 
program will begin at 8:00 
a.m. and run until 3:00 p.m. 
There will be a $10. charge 
including lunch. Sessions 
will cover laws and 
regulations. , 	past ur e 
management, predator 
control, pond management, 
beef, and brush control. 
Please RSVP to the 
Extension office 668.5412, 
by Feb. 20. 

RECENT RAIN HAS 
HELPED SOME WHEAT 

PRODUCERS 
Showers through out the 

state have brought relief to 
some wheat producers. 
Almost 6 million acres of 
wheat are planted each year  

and gently wash them in 
cool water and make sure 
they are dry before 
chopping or blending. Don't 
to use too much of a certain 
herb in a dish, and 
remember that some are 
good for long, slow cooking, 
and some are not. 

REMINDER TO 
PRODUCERS: SOME 

WHEAT VARIETIES ARE 
PROTECTED 

Keeping back some of a 
crops production for 
planting the following year 
is standard practice with 
many farmers. However, 
the Plant Variety Protection 
Act is being more strictly 
enforced, thanks to the use 
of DNA plant testing. The 
law says farmers may save 
a limited amount of a 
protected seed variety for 
planting. But, selling or 
giving a protected seed to 
anyone, without the 
permission of the variety 
owner, is illegal. It is a 
federal offense and can 
carry fines of up to $35,000. 
Producers should consult 
their seed provider for 
further details. 

DATES TO 
REMEMBER 

Feb 21 - 4-H Livestock 
Show; Cooke County 
Fairgrounds; CEU videos 
for Pesticide Applicators 
relicensing will be shown 
from noon until 4 p.m. if 
hours are needed. 

Feb. 25 - Farmer & 
Rancher Symposium, 5.5 
CEU hours, NCTC's Little 
Theater, 8a.m. to 3:30 p.m. 
$10 fee. Lunch will be 
served. For reservation call 
the Extension Office 
(940)668-5412. 

Feb. 24 - Marketing Club, 
7p.m., Farm Bureau 
Building 

.D DcLLca_S 
Performance Horses 

Accepting Outside Horses 
From Start To Finish. 

Specializing in 
Reining/Working Cowhorse 

Youth Instruction 
Training & Board S720/Month 

Located 
Hillis Akin Ranch 
Gainesville, Texas 

940-665-3172 

Carmen & Dallas David 
940-637-1165 

in Texas, with half being 
used for winter pasture. 
Producers in the Gulf Coast 
region have had near-ideal 
growing conditions so far. 
However, the northern and 
eastern parts of the state 
have been dry. The recent 
rain has offered some relief, 
but producers are still 
planning on feeding hay a 
month longer than usual. 

HOMEGROWN HERBS 
ADD ZEST TO RECIPES 
Growing herbs at home 

can be a fun and 
inexpensive way to make 
food tasty. They are simple 
to grow if you follow some 
easy rules. Herbs should be 
grown where there is plenty 
of drainage. They need a 
minimum of five to six 
hours of sunlight each day, 
and should be grown in 
garden soil that is neither 
too rich nor too poor. When 
cooking with herbs, be sure 

• Enhancing timber 
harvesting by reducing 
understory, improving 
visibility, and allowing trees 
to be easily marked. 

• Stimulating new growth 
of plants, which provide food 
for wildlife. 

One of the dangers of 
controlled burning is smoke, 
which can cause traffic 
accidents and fatalities, 
leading to lawsuits. The 
best weather for a controlled 
burn is between 20° and 
50°F; relative humidity 
between 30 and 55%; with 
fairly clear skies and 
constant wind between 5 
and 12 mph. Make sure 
your plants are not too dry 
or too wet, which can cause 
out-of-control burns or 
increased smoke, 
respectively. And remember 
to check with your local 
environmental agency first 
to see if burns are regulated 
or allowed. 

A 	trusted 	voice 
throughout rural America, 
Progressive Farmer 
magazine 
(www.progressivefarmenco 
m) sets the standard for 
living in the country and 
taps into the unique 
challenges and joys that 
landowners of all size 
experience 

Gaineville Anarket 
 



S  Franks 	 2FOR 
BARS MEAT OR CHICKEN 	

I 

$ 1 49 
Turkey Ham 
JENNIE-0 BONELESS 

SHUR SAVING 

Draft  t 	I  99  Liquid 
Beer  49. 	Bleach 

GALLON 	 

2FoR$3 

$ 1 29 

89' 
$ I 39 

99' 
$ 1 09 

icken 
4 OZ $ 2 "  

$159 
4 OZ 

4 OZ $ 	
19 

$1 59 
3 OZ 

CELLO PACK SNO WHITE 

Mushrooms 
BREAKFAST SIZE 

Grapefruit 
FRESH 

Cilantro 

8 OZ 2 3 
FO! I 

3 FOR I 

$ 289  

HEAVY BEEF 

Strip Steak 
$539 

LB. 
PILGRIM'S PRIDE JUMBO PACK 	590  
Drumsticks or Thighs 	LE, 

LENTEN SPECIALS 
Whole Tilapia 	LB 99

0  
$1 79 

.B 	I 

$ I 79 
LB  

$269  LB 

MARKET WRAPPED 

American Cheese 

I LB. BLOCKS . MILD 

Cheddar Cheese 

FARM RAISED 

Catfish Filets 	 

21 OZ. 

SHURFINE 15 15 OZ 

Mixed Vegetables, 

Creamed Style Corn, 
Whole Kernel Corn 

SHURFINE 

Apple or Cherry 

Pie Filling 

3FOR $  I $ 139 

16 OZ $2 99  

FROZEN & DAIRY 
48- 

Ice 
Cream 
I 2 GAL CTN.  

SHURFINE 
ASSORTED 

3 $5  for  
SUNDAE NUTTY CONES 

Blue Bunny Novelties 6 CT $ 2 79  
STOUFFER'S ASSORTED 

2 FORS  Entrees 	82-11.5 OZ. 

STOUFFER'S BEEF STUFFED 	

$ 2 99  Green Bell Peppers 15.5 OZ. 

ASSORTED 	

$299 Van de Kamp's Fish20_26 oz. 
SHURFINE $ 
Margarine Quarters I LB 3 FOR 

SHURFINE 
ASSORTED VARIETIES 
PREMIUM QUALITY 

Milk 
GALLON 

$ I 99 

KRAFT ASSORTED 

Velveeta 	 
SHURFINE ASSORTED 

Yogurt 
SHURFINE ASSORTED CHUNK OR 	

$299 Halfmoon Cheese 16 02 

SHURFINE ASSORTED 

Jumbos Biscuits 	CT 99' 

6 OZ 3 FOR I , 
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TOWNTALK 
SANDWICH 

White 
Bread 

24 OZ. LOAF 

Miller 
Lite 

or Miller Genuine 

SHURFINE WHITE FLAKE 	
$ 29 

Coconut 	14 OZ. I 

REGULAR 52.29 $q  
Fritos' or Cheetos'io oz J FOR 6618 

FRITO-LAVA • $ A 
Canned Dips 	9 OZ LFOR 

SHURFINE PINK 

Grapefruit Juice 	46 OZ. 79 
KRAFT ORIGINAL OR EXTREME • 54, 
Easy Mac 	12 901 LFOR 

QUICK COOKING RICE 

Minute Rice $ 28 OZ 2 79  
KRAFT ASSORTED 

It's Pasta Anytime IS . 25 OZ 2F0!4 

OZ. 2FOISi 3 
CT LFOR 

, 
$ 1 49 

99t 
99 0  
99 ,  
99' 4 ROLL ANGEL SOFT 

Tissue 

89' Bounty Towels 

Mph 

19 OZ. RICE KRISPIES OR 
25 OZ. FROSTED FLAKES 

Kellogg's 
Cereal 

MIX OR MATCH 

7 

CHICKEN OF THE SEA 

Small Shrimp 
CHICKEN OF THE SEA 

Medium Shrimp 
CHICKEN OF THE SEA 

Tiny Shrimp 
CHICKEN OF THE SEA 

Smoked Oysters 
CHICKEN OF THE SEA 

1 Whole Oysters 	8 OZ $ 99  
CHICKEN OF THE SEA 

Mackerel     15 OZ 79' 
CHICKEN OF THE SEA-OVAL CAN 

Sardines IN TOM SAUCE 15 OZ 99 
CHICKEN OF THE SEA ASSORTED 

Sardines 	 42  OZ 59' 

EX. STRENGTH TABLETS OR ASSTD. $.91 19 
Excedrin Migraine 	24 CT J 
WESTERN FAMILY ORIG OR MAX. STRENGTH $ 1 69 
Stomach Relief 	B OZ 

ASSORTED INVISIBLE SOLID 
	

$ I79 
Suave Anti•perspirant _2.6 OZ. I 

KLEENEX SELECT GROUP 

Facial Tissue 	65-160 CT 99c 

ffisther s 
FISCHER'S 

Cube Steak 

$299 
LB. 

FISCHER'S FULLY COOKED 

Sausage 

$219 
LB. 

FISCHER'S 

Sack Sausage 

$ I 79 
LB. 

DECKER MARKET SLICED 

Bologna 	 LB 
$ 149 

12 PK. Natural 
Light 

Le $2 9  

FISCHER'S REGULAR 

Summer Sausage 

$269  

FISCHER'S JALAPENO 

Summer Sausage 

$5 EZ PEEL. 71-90, RAW 	 99  
Shrimp 	2 LB. BAG 

SHURFINE . 7.5 O

Pimento Cheese 	EA 
S 1 19 Z. 

PRICES 24 02 

Pimento Cheese EA$2 99  

Dr. Pepper 
$249  

12 OZ - 1 2 PACK 

RED RIPE 

Strawberries 

1 LB. 	 I 

FRESH 

Yellow Onions 	2 LBS$  

WASHINGTON EXTRA FANCY 

Braeburn or Fuji Apples LB. 
$129 

Bosc Pears 	LB 99' 
FRESH 

EUROPEAN BAKERS SLICED 

French Bread 	If 

EUROPEAN BAKERS 

Garlic Bread Sticks 
HEFTY 10 12 IN . 24 CT 

Compartment Plates 

HEFTY 8 7 8 IN 25 CT . 

Flat Plates 

SHURFINE 16 OZ 18 CT 

Plastic Cups 

LIBBY 

Asparagus Spears 

ASSORTED 
HAIR CARE 

White 
Rain 
4-15 OZ. 

).• 

PACK 

GROCERY SPECIALS 
SHURFINE 10. 75 - 16 OZ ASSTO 

Fudge or Caramel 

IS 02 

Zesta Crackers 

SHURFINE 18.25 OZ. ASST'D 

Cake Mixes 

SHURFINE 

Sugar 

SHURFINE 

Chocolate Chips 

HORMEL 

Chili 

FRESH 

Hass 
Avocados 

FOR 
3  $1 

FISCHER'S MARKET SLICED 

Bacon 

MArff.fg,  
DOLE ASSORTED COMPLETE 

Caesar Salad 	looz. 2 FOM 

	  Coconuts 	 EA 99' 
TROPICAL 

ULAN Since 1927 
We Wouldn't be 76 Without You! 

SENIOR CITIZENS: 
No Amount of Purchase 
Necessary On Limited Sale Items! 

NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR PICTORIAL OR TYPOGRAPHICAL ERRORS . R 
("ARMY RIGHTS 

RESERVED 

c. FFILIATED 
FOODS INC. 
01 An Wilk, 

ALL ITEMS NOT 
AVAILABLE AT ALL 
AFFILIATED STORES 

Itstber's Allot  filarkrt 

$ I 99 

SINCE 1927 
304 North Main, Muenster, TX • 1 (800) 259-7248 or 759-4211 

DOUBLE COUPONS EVERY DAY PRICES EFFECTIVE 

FEB 23 - 29, 2004 
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