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With the long weekend for
Labor Day approaching, the 
Texas Department of Public 
Safety is making its custom­
ary preparations for Operation 
Motorcide. Major Smith, com­
mander of Region 1, which 
includes this area, estimates 
from past experience that 
Texas will have 45 traffic trag­
edies during the four-day per­
iod. At the same time he or­
ganizes a safety campaign to 
keep some of those predicted 
tragedies from happening.

There will be more patrol­
men than usual on the job 
during that period. Major 
Smith said that every available 
officer has been assigned to 
duty. By the law of averages 
traffic violators will have less 
chance to escape arrest. Peo­
ple who are inclined to cheat 
on the regulations would be 
wise to keep that fact in mind.

Also during the long holi­
day, there will be another 
group of men helping the DPS 
keep order on the highways. 
Known as the “Holiday Road 
Patrol” , it consists of dedi­
cated men who will assist peo­
ple in distress. They donate 
their time on July 4 and La­
bor Day weekends. Their 
equipment consists of flares, 
fuses, water, gasoline, battery 
cables, etc.

The Holiday Road Patrol 
sign on the back of their cars 
will be a welcome sign to 
stranded motorists. The dis­
tress signal asking for their 
help will be a white handker­
chief on the left door handle 
and a raised hood. At night the 
signal is a burning dome light 
and the raised hood.

We have a feeling that com­
bined efforts of DPS and those 
Good Samaritans of the road 
will reduce the coming week­
end’s highway slaughter. How­
ever they can’t be everywhere. 
Drivers must realize that they 
are the principal performers in 
the special safety effort.

Another Labor Day thought:
While customary oratory ac­
ross the nation glorifies organ­
ized Labor for its tremendous 
help to working people, some 
of the labor groups are getting 
set for another round of 
strikes.

One of those is the United 
Auto Workers. Weeks ago it 
published a list of demands 
along with a threat to strike 
if they are not met. The pub­
lic is wondering now which 
company will become the vic­
tim of UAW’s test.

The public also wonders 
when we will finally come to 
an end of demands. When 
will wage rates finally be 
stabilized, giving the country’s 
economy a long delayed op­
portunity to level off? After 
many years of sad experience 
the labor leaders as well as 
the economic experts must 
realize that no real gains were 
made in the long succession 
of past pay increases. The re­
sult invariably has been an 
increase of prices, after which 
the average worker’s pay 
bought no more than before. 
As far as current income is 
concerned, he’s back on the 
same old economic level.

At the same time, however,
he loses in another way. The 
increased price has decreased 
the buying power of his sav­
ings. Life insurance, bonds, 
bank savings and checking a- 
ccounts all decrease in real 
value and the over-all result is 
that the worker actually has 
lost. The wage increase move­
ment of these many years has 
been a cruel hoax. How can 
it be otherwise, when income 
only maintains the same eco­
nomic level but savings lose 
their value?

At the same time many 
others become victims of even 
greater injustice . They are 
subject to the same price in­
creases. But they are on a 
fixed income. They get no 
raise. So they lose on both 
their current income and their 
savings.

This is not intended to im­
ply that no one should ever 
receive a raise. Industry of­
fers plenty opportunity for 
promotion as people advance 
to more responsible positions. 
And there should be bonuses 
whereby workers can share in 
a firm’s good fortune. But pay 
raises sustained only by in­
creased prices are a burden on 
people who have to buy, and 
that includes the firm’s work­
ers themselves.

A reason given for UAW
demands is the excess profit 
of car companies. It says work­
ers are due some of that pro­
fit. Assuming the claim is true, 
the UAW could render a much 
greater service to the country 
and its members by demand­
ing a decrease in car prices.

Suppose UAW did that, and 
(Continued on page 8)

Muenster Enterprise
VOLUME XXXI MUENSTER, COOKE COUNTY, TEXAS 76252 SEPTEMBER 1, 1967 NUMBER 41

Schools Enroll 749, 
13 Under Last Year

Bro. Thomas Moster 
Returns from Trip 
Around the World

Brother T h o m a s  Moster, 
teaching world history at Sac­
red Heart School this year, will 
find that subject easy for him­
self while making it interest­
ing for his students. He re­
turned last week from a trip 
around the world. And can 
draw on his own sight-seeing, 
studies, and experiences of the 
two-month tour for his classes.

From departure from San 
Francisco after sight - seeing 
through the bay area, sea 
travel to Hawaii, lei greetings 
in Honolulu and air travel 
through a dozen foreign coun­
tries, the trip left never to be 
forgotten memories.

His itinerary included Japan: 
Yokahama, Atami, Kyoto, and 
Osaka. Hong Kong: a tour of 
the island with a look across 
the “Bamboo Curtain” into 
China — 500 yards from the 
Red China border, a tour of 
Thailand, highlighted by visit­
ing the unusual Floating Mar­
ket.

India, with its ancient way 
of life, religion and people 
everywhere, provided a first 
hand study of that country. 
The Taj Mahal and Ganges 
River trip were among high­
lights.

In Iran the ancient city of 
Ray and the city of Tehran 
provided the chief tourist in­
terest. In Turkey, Istanbul 
was outstanding with Saint 
Sophia, the largest Byzantine 
Church in the world. And a 
tour of Ephesus took the trav­
elers over the same routes the 
Blessed Mother trod during 
her lifetime and until her 
death there.

Jordan, Israel and Syria — 
a 700 mile tour of the area — 
made close contact with all the 
sacred places in Jerusalem, 
Jerico, Bethany, Bethlehem, 
Herbron, Nazareth, C a n a ,  
Capharnaum, Tiberas, Haifa, 
Tel-Aviv and Mount Tabor.

In Greece, travel took the 
tourists to Athens, Corinth and 
Delphi. The Acropolis of Ath­
ens was among top sights.

And finally Italy—climaxed 
in Rome with a general audi­
ence with the Holy Father at 
Castle Gondolfo. Seeing the 
Vatican, the Catacombs and 
many other sights in the Holy 
City. In Florence evidence of 
last fall’s floods were still 
noticable. A jet air trip to New 
York completed the world cir­
cle.

Souvenirs, pictures and vol­
umes of notes that came back 
with Brother Thomas will pro­
vide many interesting history 
classes for his students.

Major Changes of 
New Election Law 
Listed by Official

Secretary of State John Hill 
has provided Texas election of­
ficials details of all changes in 
state election laws enacted by 
the 60th Legislature.

Major changes include:
Voters may mark ballots 

with “x” or check marks ra­
ther than scratching names of 
candidates they oppose.

Counties may use electronic 
voting machines on approval of 
the secretary of state.

Those who have not yet met 
state voting residence require­
ments may vote for president 
and vice-president.

Those who have moved from 
county to county within six 
months before an election can 
vote for statewide officials.

Some city election dates will 
be changed from the first 
Tuesday in April to the first 
Saturday in April.

Election officials will get a 
pay raise from $1 to $1.25 an 
hour.

Voters in bond elections will 
be required to sign affidavits 
they own property and to i- 
dentify the property.

Write-in votes will be out­
lawed in primaries except for 
party offices, like county 
chairman.

Only opposed candidates will 
have to file campaign expense 
statements.

Voters again must register 
between October 1 and Jan­
uary 31. All voters must sign 
up (including citizens over 60 
in cities of less than 10,000 
population).

B I R T H S

Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Reiter 
announce a daughter, weight 
eight pounds eight ounces, 
born at Nocona Hospital 7:10 
a.m. Wednesday, Aug. 30 
Others welcoming her are 
three sisters and one brother 
and grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
T. F. Lovell of Gainesville and 
Mrs. Hilda Reiter.

3 Teams Left in Softball Tourney
T h e  softball tournament 

sponsored here this week by 
The Center has only one semi­
final and the final left on its 
schedule.

Bullard of Gainesville cinch­
ed a place in the champ con­
test by edging Muenster Cen­
ter 11-8 Wednesday night. The 
other contender will be de­
cided Thursday night when 
First State Bank tangles with 
Bell Telephone. Both are 
Gainesville teams.

Up to now four games have 
been played in the single 
elimination tournament. Mon­
day night First State Bank 
beat Muenster Independents 
9-2 and Bell beat Gainesville 
Independents 11-3. Tuesday 
night the Center licked Gaines­
ville National Bank 17-4 and 
Wednesday night Center was 
eliminated by Bullard.

Softball League 
Sets Benefit Game

Muenster a n d  Gainesville 
softball players will end a 
busy season with a benefit 
game Saturday night, Septem­
ber 2. They will play at Fair- 
view park and proceeds will 
make up a gift purse for the 
Jimmy Call Family.

Call, one of the county soft- 
ball league’s players, lost an 
infant son last week following 
open heart surgery. Game pro­
ceeds will be given to him to 
help pay the heavy expense of 
sickness and death.

The contest will be an all- 
star event. Muenster will play 
an outfit picked from other 
teams of the county softball 
loop.Hornets Lose by 2 TDs in Practice With Allen High

The Hornets were outscored 
12-0 in their scrimmage with 
Allen High last Thursday, but 
Coach Glenn Richardson was 
pleased anyway.

Considering the opposition, 
he thinks his boys did a good 
job. Allen was runner up of 
its district last year and lost 
only four men by graduation. 
That leaves them a stout out­
fit for this year, featuring a 
pair of husky colored boys who 
move hard and fast.

The action consisted of 20 
offensive plays for one team 
then 20 for the other. Play 
started from the 30 and the 
team had to make first down 
yardage to keep moving, other­
wise it started over from 
the 30.

In its first 20 plays Allen 
scored both of its TD’s one on 
a long run the other on a pass 
and long run. After that the 
Hornet defense improved and 
the visitors were held to short­
er yardage and some setbacks.

Muenster gains were most­
ly short and produced only one 
sustained drive — which ran 
out of plays before it reached 
the goal. A few other nice 
gains were lost by failure to 
keep going in the next series 
of downs.

The Hornets this year fea­
ture an inexperienced back- 
field. Three of the four are 
new and the other has had 
only one year. However it has 
the help of a sturdy line, which 
has most of the team’s brawn 
and experience.

A tough break coming from 
the scrimmage was a cracked 
rib for quarterback Bobby 
Bruns. That seems to carry on 
the team’s quarterback trouble. 
John Monday, a reserve last 
year, was due to pilot the team 
this year and broke a shoulder 
shortly before school started.

Quarterback for this week’s 
scrimmage at Prosper will be 
Joe Klement, about a 100 
pounder, who has been all 
right at calling plays and 
handling the ball but .lacks 
the heft for running and 
throwing. Meanwhile Richard­
son is keeping Bruns in con­
dition, hopes to have him in 
the lineup for the opening 
game with Lindsay on Sept.8.

The Hornet schedule:
Sept. 8, Lindsay, here.
Sept. 15, Fannindel, there. 
Sept. 22, Lake Dallas, there. 
Sept. 29, Pleasant Grove, here. 
Oct. 6, Alvord, here.
Oct. 13, Callisburg, there.
Oct. 20, Chico, there.
Oct. 27, Valley View, here. 
Nov. 10, Era, there.
Nov. 17, Saint Jo, here.

The Pleasant Grove game on 
Sept. 29 will start at 8 o’clock. 
All other Hornet games will 
start at 7:30. The last six 
games, beginning October 6, 
are conference games.

School Routine 
To Return After 
Labor Day Holiday

Labor Day will be a holiday 
for all of Muenster’s school 
children. Announcements to 
that effect were made this 
week by Superintendents L. B. 
Bruns and Father Alcuin 
Kubis.

Further anno u n c e m e n t s  
from the superintendents also 
indicated that the students will 
get down to regular routine 
after that. At Sacred Heart 
the faculty has been short- 
handed — with Father Andrew 
and Sister Roberta both in the 
hospital. Also children were 
dismissed early because of the 
heat. Starting Tuesday teach­
ers are expected back and 
classes will go the full time.

Irregularities at the public 
school were caused mostly by 
lack of space. The new build­
ing with 8 classrooms was un­
finished and trying to impro­
vise caused too many prob­
lems. Children got a holiday 
Tuesday while four rooms 
were finished and equipment 
was installed. With those 
rooms in use the faculty man­
aged all right Wednesday and 
is operating the same way 
Thursday and Friday. Because 
of confusion, and heat, classes 
were dismissed early at the 
public school also.

Superintendent Bruns ex­
pects the other four classrooms 
to be ready next Tuesday and 
the full class schedule to go 
into effect.

Guest Speaker Is 
On Program for 
Hospital Auxiliary

Members of Muenster Hospi­
tal Auxiliary had a guest 
speaker at their recent meet­
ing, hearing Bob Majors of 
Sherman, representative of the 
Dale Carnegie course.

During business Mrs. Henry 
Starke presided and members 
made plans for their next 
benefit — their annual fall 
buffet dar.ce. It will be held 
in November, exact date still 
to be announced.

In other business the group 
heard a report on the bene­
fit ice cream supper which 
netted $141.95. This, added to 
receipts from the bake sale, 
paid off $545.00 on the hospi­
tal’s cardiac equipment, the 
organization’s chief project.

Twenty members and Sis­
ter Mildred attended. Mrs. 
Starke won the door prize, a 
five dollar gift certificate from 
the Center Coffee Shop.

News of the 
Men in Service

Two Enlist In The Navy
John Henry Streng and Louis 

Heilman are this city’s most 
iecent young men in uniform, 
training at the U.S. Naval 
Training Center in San Diego, 
Calif. Their parents are Mr. 
and Mrs. John P. Streng and 
Mr. and Mrs. Charley Heilman. 
Both are 1967 high school grad­
uates and enlisted in the avia­
tion field. On completion of 
basic training they’ll have 
14-day boot leaves and then 
report to Memphis, Tenn., for 
Aviation Fundamental School. 
Louis joins a brother in the 
armed forces. Don Heilman is 
training at Fort Polk, La.
Headed For Home

The John Huchtons are 
counting down the days now
___  their son David is due
home soon. He’s to leave Ger­
many Sunday after two years 
in the Army there, will be sep­
arated from the service at Fort 
Hamilton, N. J., and be home 
for Labor Day, if the present 
schedule works out.
Change Of Address

Wayne Cler writes his par­
ents, the Werner Clers, about 
keeping busy in Thailand, and 
mentions a change of address. 
It’s Spec. 4 Wayne Cler; 16th 
Engr. Co., 538th Engr. Bn,; 
A P O San Francisco, Calif. 
96330.

Meet In Korea
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Sand- 

mann of Lindsay have a letter 
from their son Spec. 4 Donald 
Sandmann, based in Korea, 
telling about happy surprises. 
While he was in Seoul, looking 
around in a PX he walked in­
to Spec. 4 Pat Klement of 
Muenster. It was the first time 
the soldiers met since they are 
in Korea. Donald is there since 
March, Pat since April this 
year. While they were wait­
ing for a bus to return to their 
base, they met Eddie Schafer, 
another Cooke County boy, 
who was in basic with Donald 
at Fort Carson and the three 
“talked up a storm.” Pat is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Tony 
Klement.

NEWS
OF THE SICK

Tommy Felderhoff Jr. had 
his right forearm badly lacer­
ated and the bone splintered 
Friday afternoon when it was 
caught in the auger of a grain 
combine. Almost two hours 
were spent freeing the arm by 
cutting the auger tube with 
a portable grinder. Tommy is 
in Muenster Hospital with a 
good chance of recovering full 
use of the arm.

Father Andrew Wewer has 
been in Muenster Hospital 
since last Thursday for ob­
servation and treatment, and 
expects to be dismissed during 
this weekend. Meanwhile he 
has been relieved of duties as 
assistant Sacred Heart pastor 
by two priests from Subiaco 
Abbey. Father Eugene Luke 
was here Friday to Wednesday, 
Father Alois Fuhrmann is here 
now. Abbot Michael Lensing, 
on a car trip to Dallas, brought 
Father Alois here and took Fa­
ther Eugene back.

Andy O’Connor continues as 
a patient at Saint Jo Hospital. 
He entered Aug. 15 for therapy.

Mrs. Archie Livingston of 
Myra who spent two days at 
Gainesville Hospital for medi­
cal has been dismissed.

HOSPITAL NOTES
The following patients were 

admitted and dismissed during 
the past week at Muenster 
Memorial Hospital.

Thursday: Admit — J. C. 
Trachta, Mrs. Joe Starke, Rev. 
Andrew Wewer. Dismiss — 
Mrs. Harry Otto.

Friday: Admit — Thomas 
Felderhoff Jr., Mrs. Katie 
Fleitman. Dismiss — Mrs. Ray­
mond Kubicek, Vernon, Mrs. 
Addie Anderson, Forestburg, 
Mrs. Joe Starke, Joe Luke.

Saturday: Admit — Frank 
Scott, Forestburg, Mrs. Ted 
Gremminger. Dismiss — Mar­
tha Glaassley, Nocona, J. C. 
Trachta.

Sunday: Admit — Mrs. Lin­
da Roberson, Nocona.

Monday: Admit — C e c i l  
Chaney, Saint Jo, Sister Ro­
berta O.S.B.

Tuesday: Dismiss — Mrs. 
Linda Roberson, Nocona, Cecil 
Chaney, Saint Jo.

Wednesday: Admit — Mein- 
rad Stoffels.

Grass Judging 
Contest Scheduled 
For Soil District

The 18th annual grass judg­
ing contest sponsored by su­
pervisors of the Upper Elm- 
Red Soil and Water Conserva­
tion District will be held on 
Saturday, September 30 at 
Cooke County Junior College.

Plans for it were completed 
at the supervisors’ regular 
meeting on August 17.

The contest will follow state 
rules and it is open to all vo- 
vational agriculture and 4-H 
members of the district.

Back from Germany
Ludwig Kieninger returned 

Sunday night from a three- 
week visit in Germany, at 
Passau, Bavaria, with his 
mother, brothers and sisters. 
It was his first return in al­
most 15 years. He found the 
country still beautiful but 
with much of its old world 
charm gone. Instead it is mod­
ern, almost crowded with new 
buildings and industry, dif­
ferent from the homeland he 
left. It was a happy visit with 
his family, he said. But he 
was ready to return “home” to 
his adopted country. He made 
the trip both ways by air.

Local CYC members at a 
regular meeting last week 
Wednesday heard reports on 
the Christian Youth Work­
shop, the deanery meeting at 
Gainesville and a splash party 
hosted by Gainesville CYC. 
Twenty-three members attend­
ed the meeting at which Miss 
Cynthia Bindel, president, pre­
sided. It was announced that 
Father Robert Sykora of 
Gainesville is new deanery 
moderator for the youth group.

Visitors wjth the Henscheid 
clan three days and trying to 
see all the relationship were 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Case 
and daughters Sandy and 
Sherri and Mrs. Case’s sister, 
Sister Violet, all of Iowa. They 
are daughters and grandchil­
dren of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hen­
scheid of Westphalia, Iowa.

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Scog­
gins went to St. Joseph, La., 
Sunday to help move his sis­
ter, Mrs. Kenneth Barrier to 
Wichita Falls. They returned 
home Tuesday then went to 
Wichita Falls Wednesday to 
help her get settled.

Enrollment figures this week 
at the two Muenster schools 
add to 749, a decrease of 13 
from the starting figure a year 
ago. The public school’s count 
is 422 and the parochial 
school’s is 327.

Combined counts of de­
partments in the two schools 
shows the community with 520 
elementary students and 229 
high school students. There 
are 277 elementary and 145 
high school students at the 
public school; 243 elementary 
and 84 high school students atSH Nips Lindsay And Gainesville B In Scrimmages

Sacred Heart’s Tigers, un­
der direction of Coach Thomas 
Williams, lived up to their 
early rating last Friday by 
outscoring Gainesville Hi B 
24-6.

The Tigers were sharp on 
both offense and defense as 
they put their experience and 
their size to good use. Williams 
was happy with their per­
formance and looks forward to 
a good season if he is able to 
keep the team intact. How­
ever, lack of depth will begin 
hurting soon when first string­
ers come out of the game.

Squad membership dropped 
to 18 this week when Clifford 
Sicking enrolled at Muenster 
High School. Seven of those 
are seniors and five are jun­
iors. Freshmen and sophomores 
are evenly divided, 3 and 3.

In the tussle with Gaines­
ville B Tommy Hess crossed 
the goal twice, on a running 
play and a pass play. Steve 
Hess scored on a draw play 
and Stan Endres made a TD 
on a nice run following re­
covery of a fumble in the air. 
Gainesville boys got their 
counter on an end sweep the 
last play of the session.

Method of play was to give 
20 offensive plays to each team 
in a series. The net result was 
that Sacred Heart moved con­
sistently. Lee Roy Hess at the 
quarterback slot passed ac­
curately and also did a fine 
job of ball handling and run­
ning. Steve and Tommy Hess 
looked good in ball toting, 
blocking and defensive play. 
The entire forward line showed 
strength and experience, of­
fensively and defensively.

Outclass Lindsay
The Tigers looked equally 

good, possibly better in their 
scrimmage at Lindsay Wed­
nesday afternoon. The score 
was 30-0, of which 24 points 
were earned on offense and 6 
on defense.

That’s right, 6 on defense. 
The ball went into play on 
the 10 and Tiger defense in 
the first series of downs push­
ed the Knights back behind 
their goal line. That happened 
three times.

Coach Williams said his boys 
seemed to be in mid season 
form. They worked together 
fine, made few mistakes. The 
main strength of their offense 
was passing in which accuracy 
and completions were both 
good. Stan Endres took two 
for TDs. on gains of about 
60 and 30.

Running gains were short 
and steady. Scoring plays in 
that department were by Steve 
Hess for 2 yards and Chris 
Walter for 1 yard.

Lindsay’s effort was better 
than the score indicated. They 
did fine most of the time, how­
ever they showed signs of 
starting jitters and will look 
better when they calm down. 
Williams also assumed that 
the swich from 8-man to l i ­
man play somewhat handi­
capped the Knights.

That ends scrimmage for the 
Tigers. Next comes their sea­
son opener with Saint Jo. And 
Lindsay is heading for its 
opener with Muenster.

The Tiger schedule, with 
only six games when practice 
started, has increased to seven 
games. Coach Williams is still 
willing to add more but his 
hopes are dim. The schedule: 
Sept. 8, Saint Jo, there, 8 p.m. 
Sept. 30, Anna, here, 8 p.m. 
Oct. 6, Fort Worth Day School,

there, 4:30 p.m.
Oct. 13, Greenhill, here,

7:30 p.m.
NoV. 3, Dallas Christain, here,

8 p.m.
Nov. 10, Windthorst, there,

8 p.m.
Nov. 18, Notre Dame, here,

7:30 p.m.

Sacred Heart.
The figures reflect the 

second year of a substantial in­
crease at the public school and 
a corresponding decrease at 
Sacred Heart. Last year the 
starting enrollment was 305 at 
the public school and 457 at 
Sacred Heart. Two years ago 
the starting figures were 170 
and 588.

Nevertheless the number of 
transfers did not run as high 
as expected. A survey early 
in the summer indicated a 
possible enrollment of 440 at 
the public school. Teachers 
were hired and other prepara­
tions were made on the basis 
of that survey. The school was 
almost ready when the chil­
dren reported Monday. Still 
missing were the eight new 
classrooms which were not 
quite finished in time. Four 
of them were in use Wednes­
day, the rest of the building 
is expected to be ready for 
next week.

Enrollments are listed as fol-
lows:

SH Sch. Pub. Sch.
Grade 1 42 25
Grade 2 41 30
Grade 3 36 34
Grade 4 20 36
Grade 5 30 40
Grade 6 23 30
Grade 7 26 42
Grade 8 25 40
Grade 9 19 39
Grade 10 18 47
Grade 11 30 34
Grade 12 17 25

327 422

Service Personnel 
Named at Schools

Bus drivers and kitchen per­
sonnel at the Muenster schools 
this year have been announced 
as follows.

At the public school cooks 
are Mmes. Susanna Noggler, 
Hilda Reiter and Albert Fleit­
man. Drivers are Gary Sluder, 
Donald Fisher, Dickie Embry, 
Joe Felderhoff and Herbert 
Sicking.

At the parochial school.cooks 
are Mmes. Lawrence Martin, 
Gertrude Bayer and Pete Koel- 
zer. The school is operating 
four busses but has six persons 
licensed to drive them. They 
are Thomas Williams, Father 
Benedict, P a u l  Hoedebeck, 
Stan Endres, Steve Hess and 
Mrs. Raymond Zimmerer. Ben 
Fleitman Jr. will also be li­
censed when he reaches 18 in 
October.

Caretakers are Bill Knabe 
at Sacred Heart and James 
Eckart at the public school.

Season Ends at 
Swimming Pool

Swimming season at Muens­
ter ended abruptly during the 
past weekend. Since starting 
of school reduced swim time 
to only the weekends for most 
kids, the council decided to 
quit business.

After a regular day Sunday, 
the pool was drained Monday.

City Manager Steve Moster 
said that the season’s financial 
report will be about as usual. 
The pool failed to pay its way, 
but the loss was comparatively 
small, representing a very low 
cost for the recreation and 
physical benefits realized by 
the children.

Muenster Wins 
Top Trophy in 
County Tourney

In a thrilling story book 
ending the Center softballers 
won the champ trophy in the 
Cooke County Softball Tourna­
ment.

A ninth inning homer by 
Tommy Herr gave the Muens­
ter team a 2-1 decision over 
Bell Telephone, which had pre­
viously won the ’67 trophy of 
the Cooke County Softball 
League.

First score for The Center 
came in the third as Tommy 
Flusche doubled, stole third, 
and scored on Joe Felder- 
hoff’s sacrifice. Tommy Carr 
tied the count for Bell in the 
next inning with a hefty wal­
lop over the left field fence.

After that the score was 
deadlocked until Herr blasted 
out his long one.

Pitching for Muenster, Al­
vin Hartman gave up five hits 
and no walks while fanning 
five. Puckett, for Bell, allowed 
six hits and three walks and 
struck out five.

The Center’s hitters were 
Tommy Herr, a homer, Tom 
Flusche, a double, Joe Felder­
hoff, Adam Wolf, Willie Wal- 
terscheid and Alvin Hartman, 
each a single.
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Fleitman Sisters 
Back from Abroad

Every day, all day, was a 
highlight, said Miss Theresa 
(Blondie) Fleitman when asked 
to tell some of the highlights 
of her European trip. “Paris 
was the most fun,” chimed in 
her younger sister, Miss Janie 
Fleitman. The two spent 43 
days traveling abroad.

Both agreed however that 
Rome was of paramount in­
terest and that seeing the Holy 
Father and receiving his bles­
sing in a general audience was 
the brightest highlight. Closely 
akin to that experience was

Sorry!
We're Closed 
Until Sept. 5Dorothy’s Fashionette Beauty Salon
303 S. Chestnut 

Gainesville

Any erroneous reflection upon 
the character, standing or repu­
tation of any person, firm or 
corporation that may appear in 
the Enterprise will be corrected 
upon being brought to the at­
tention of the PubUsher.

the candlelight procession at 
Lourdes and then there was 
Fatima.

Their trip began by jet from 
Dallas to New York, then five 
luxurious days at sea aboard 
the SS France. They disem­
barked at Southampton and 
proceeded to London for two 
days.

Sight - seeing continued at 
Windsor, Oxford, Stratford, 
Coventry, Cambridge and Col­
chester. Then a motor trip to 
Harwich to board a night 
steamer across the North Sea 
to Holland . . .  touring Amster­
dam a full day, then southward 
through pictuersque country­
side in Holland to Germany 
and Cologne, a scenic cruise 
on the Rhine River, and by 
motorcoach to Mainz, then 
Heidelberg and on to Lucerne 
for a Swiss holiday.

Venice, the city of canals 
and bridges, was next on the 
itinerary . . .  seemingly endless 
sight - seeing, shopping f o r  
Venetian glass and lace and 
swimming at Lido Beach.

Continuing sight-seeing the 
trip took them to Pauda, Ver­
ona, Modena, Bologna and 
Florence and on to Rome . . .  
the Vatican, Castle Gondoflo, 
museums, basilicas, cathedrals, 
and a day of leiseure to ex­
plore the ancient and modem 
splendors of the Eternal City. 
Then Pisa, Rapallo, Monaco, 
Monte Carlo and Nice. An 
evening train with sleepers to

LABOR DAY

Closeout
Prices
on all '67 models

Fords, Falcons 
and Mustangs

new and demonstrators.

ENDRES MOTOR CO.
Muenster

|

MORE HOMES ARE PAINTED 
WITH THIS HOUSE PAINT 

THAN WITH ANY OTHER BRAND

to a w iN -W iu m
SWP

HOUSE PAINT
ONE COAT WHITE 

FOR W O O D  S U R F A C E S

You get extra years of beauty and protection with Sherwin- 
Williams House Paints. Less frequent repainting saves you 
money. Their superior quality and durability have been 
proved on homes in all climates.
Whether you choose famous SWP* House Paint or the 
amazing new A-100* Latex House Paint, you are getting 
the very best house paint it’s possible to buy. Ask us which 
type is best for your home. , Jwd# Mark

COMMUNITY LUMBER CO.
Muenster, Texas

THE WORKERS
Labor Day is dedicated to all working Americans since 

our whole economic system depends on the reliability of the 
“laboring man and woman.”

For this reason it is always a pleasure to reiterate the 
importance of this major holiday that pays tribute to those 
who earn their living either by "sweat of the brow” or through 
intellectual pursuits.

Today, in this era of social reform, it is even of greater 
importance to stress this holiday as one dedicated to the liv­
ing. It is well time to remember our top priority to develop 
job opportunities for all through the regular channels of ed­
ucation, appprentice and other specialized training and through 
bootstrap assistance.

As Dwight D. Eisenhower once said; “American work­
ing men are principals in the three-member team of capital, 
management, labor. Never have they regarded themselves 
as a service class that could attain freedom only through 
destruction of the industrial economy.”

It is only through productive work that we can hope to 
attain ever-growing opportunities for all.

Lourdes.
Morning arrival in the Shrine 

City, opportunity to attend 
Mass, bathe in the miraculous 
springs, and participating in 
the candlelight procession at 
night.

From there to Bordeaus, 
Tours, Versailles before ar­
riving in Paris . . .  seeing 
everything of tourist interest 
and a day of leisure to explore 
the shops of Paris, and a flight 
to Madrid.

An excursion to Toledo, a 
flight to Lisbon and then Fa­
tima, and visiting the Shrine 
of Our Lady of Fatima and 
the Basilica and finally sight­
seeing in Lisbon before board­
ing a jet to New York, arriv­
ing the same day, with won­
derful memories of a European 
trip.

The Misses Fleitman were 
with a group of 32 accompani­
ed by Sister Ann Madeleine 
and Sister Damian of Loretta 
Heights College fauclty, Den­
ver, Colo.

Blondie has returned to Lor­
etta Heights where she is a 
junior this year. She left Sun­
day. Janie is getting ready to 
enter St. Edward’s University 
in Austin. She will be a fresh­
man.

Salvation Army 
Truck Due Sept. 18

The Salvation Army truck 
will be in Muenster on Sept. 
18 and-or 19 announces Bryon 
A. Freeman, commanding of­
ficer of the Salvation Army 
Men’s Rehabilitation Center 
for North and North Sentral 
Texas. Area residents who 
want the truck to stop by their 
home or business should call

LONG TERM
LOW INTEREST RATE
SOUND LENDING POLICIES

Since 1917 the Federal 
Land Banks have been lead­
ers in extending farm and 
ranch real estate credit. Ap­
proximately two million 
loans have been made. 
Many advantages are of­
fered in a Land Bank loan. 
Come in and get full infor­
mation. No obligation, of 
course.

Sqg
W . P. Waldrop. Mgr.
F.L.B.A. of Sherman 

P.O. Box 56, Ph. 893-3443 
or

H o w e th 's  Abstracts
each Tuesday 
in Gainesville

759-4311.
School clothing is especially 

needed at this time of year. 
This includes both summer and 
winter wear, and shoes for 
both boys and girls. Clothing 
too torn or worn to fix, is sold 
as rags and is also an import­
ant source of income for the 
Center.

The gathering of discards 
completely sustains a rehabili­
tation center that helps over 
1,000 men each year. The men 
are troubled by alcoholism or 
deep personal problems, or 
are parolees who do not have 
an “outside” sponsor to help 
them re-adjust and find a job.

Dr. J. W . Middleton
CHIROPRACTOR 

In Muenster 
Tues.. Thurs., Sat.

113 N. Main, Ph. 759-4312

Dennison Reunion 
First in 40 Years

For the first time in 40 
years seven of the eight broth­
ers and sisters of the Denni­
son family were together here 
Saturday for a reunion with 
a picnic dinner in City Park. 
Some of them were weekend 
visitors with Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Dennison, others came and re­
turned home the same day.

It was such a happy time, 
some of the group meeting 
relatives for the first time, and 
all of them reviewing family 
histories, that they plan to 
gather at the same place next 
summer. At that time they 
hope to have their sister, Mrs. 
Celesta Cox of Nashville, 
Tenn., with them. She was the 
only one missing this year.

Those present were Mr. and 
Mrs. A. H. Dennison and chil­
dren Barbara and Charles of 
Cherry Hill, N. J.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Dan Dennison and Dan­
ny and Donna of Chula Vista, 
Calif.; Mrs. Clara Beakley and 
son-in-law Sonny Henderson 
of Alvord; Mrs. Maude Beak- 
ley, Dennis and Bert, of Cen­
ter Point; Mrs. Charlsie Smith 
of Fort Worth, Mr. and Mrs. 
A. W. Dennison and Mr. and 
Mrs. Pete Dennison and chil­
dren Leigh Ann and Chris of 
Gainesville, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Dennison, James and Brad of 
Muenster.

Fine Photography

H .0 . Kinne,0.D.
OPTOMETRIST 

201 E. Calif., Gainesville
State License No. 26

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC

301 E. Broadway 
H05-3521, Gainesville 

II no answer call 
HOS-2452

G fu n f i l e t e

PltaSunacAf, Sesuaice,

MUENSTER PHARMACY
I D Hanna and Bob Pels, registered pharmicists

Save Money! 
Save Time!

Shop the
Drive-In Window 

for all your prescriptions 
and drug needs

WATTS
Prescription Shop

302 N. Grand, Gainesville
Prescription Is Our 

Middle Name

Everything
Reduced

AT OUR REMODELING

Value Conscious People Use Hotpoint

Otts Furniture
Gainesville

COMPLETE
FUNERAL
SERVICE

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home

INSURANCE
AUTO FIRE LIABILITYLeo Henscheid Insurance Agency

Phone 759-2844, Next to City Hall, Muenster

Back to School 
Duds for Boys
Fall and
Casual Slacks

New shipment, sta-press materials.Penny loafers, 5 colors Wmdbreakers, 5 colors
SHORT SLEEVEShirts . ]A off

Ideal for early school wear. 
Still a good selection.

S P O R T ’ S
104 S. Dixon, HO5-2061, Gainesville 

The name that stands for national brandsStill P A Y I N G  
Highest Rate 

Allowable
ON

T E X O M A  S A V I N G S  A S S O C I A T I O N
of Grayson County /  Sherman, Texaa

Financial Corner Crockett at Washington

ORDINARY PASSBOOK 
S A V I N G S

NO Certificate To Cancel or Mature 

NO Minimum Balance Required 

EACH Account Insured To $15,000.00 

YOUR MONEY Available W hen Needed

"Where Your Money Works Harder For You"
> i
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The Ranch Hand

1967 Pick-Ups
. . .  Progressive leaf rear springs 
. .  • Double wall cab, cuts noise and vibration 
. . .  Choice of V-6 or Straight-6 power 

C H E C K  O U R  D E A L

Hoedebeck GM C
Real Truck People 

Parts Service
Muenster

m the Country
*

1100 Springs
r ''  r...

, | ,s

Henry Henscheid 
Birthday Honoree

Henry Henscheid was hon­
ored all day August 24 in ob­
servance of his birthday. He 
was 70.

Daughters Mrs. John Darilek 
and Mrs. John Kelley and their 
children Cathy and Stephen 
Darilek and Jeff, Matt and 
Laura Kelley drove over from 
Fort Worth to spend the day. 
Children and grandchildren 
from Muenster and Lindsay 
either stopped in with gifts and 
greetings or telephoned good 
wishes.

In the evening Mr and, Mrs. 
Rufus Henscheid were hosts 
for dinner out honoring his 
father. Also in the party were 
Mrs. Henscheid and Mmes. 
Darilek and Kelly.

Visitors Thursday and Fri­
day wit hthe L. A. Bemauers 
were a niece and nephew, the 
F. E. Akins and three children 
of Waco.

I  m5
m

The Thomas Sickings and 
the Wilfred Sickings took their 
children to Lake Murray for 
a picnic and outing one day 
last week, a final vacation fling 
before school started.FinalClearance of
DRESSES

1 week only

m i m
&&•>

mm

1 group $10
were $15 to $36

1 group $5
were $10 to $15

1 group $4
were $5 to $10

Eileen Knauf and 
Frank Schilling Jr. 
Set W edding Oct. 7

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Knauf have 
announced the engagement and 
approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Miss Eileen Knauf, 
to Frank Schilling Jr., son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Schilling.

The couple has selected Sat­
urday, October 7, as the wed­
ding date. The ceremony will 
be solemnized in Sacred Heart 
Church at 4 p.m.

Chosen as the bride’s at­
tendants are her sister, Mrs. 
Theodore Walterscheid as ma­
tron of honor and Miss Debbie 
Schilling of Dallas and Mrs 
Billy Joe Dangelmayr, sisters 
of the couple, bridesmaids.

Pfc. Dwayne Schilling of 
Fort Carson, Colo., will be his 
brother’s best man. Leon 
Knauf, bride’s brother and 
Billy Joe Dangelmayr will be 
groomsmen.

Little Miss Renetta Walter- 
scneid, bride’s niece, and Brian 
Herr, bridegroom’s nephew, 
will be flower girl and ring 
bearer.

i. n u «  • vr. JOMMt. N 4 N M

Home of Fashion
Muenster

Mrs. Thomas Sicking took 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Prescher of Lindsay to Scot­
land and Windthorst Tuesday 
to visit relatives and friends. 
Mrs. Martin Hacker of Val­
ley View went with them. Mr. 
Prescher observed his 93rd 
birthday Aug. 15.

REYNOLDS W R A P 5 9 C

. . o K l A f / i y  s T V U t

STOCK UP FOR THE LONG HOLIDAY WEEKEND

■Frozen Foods-GOLDEN NIP ' F lo rid a  Froth"

ORANG E JUICE
2 V-. 25 c

TA TEt t O T  Crin k lo  Cut
POTATOES
I I  CHICO  M EXICAN  or ENCHILADA
DINNERS
TIP I  OF Pink or Plo in
LEMONADE
I A M A

FRUIT PIES

oo

*0-Oi.
Hetltk t  k M t y  Aids— — —A L A D D I N  N O T E  K O O K  3 0 0 - 0

PAPER,-.4 9 ,

31**1  
*•• 39c 

10c 
29c

Fk.

* Or. Can

SUPER SAVE
M A R K E T S

SMALL
EGGS
doz. 25c

STARTEI SET
MAN IPdAT
STYLE

.... 79e
.... 59«

t u r n  N D EO D O RA N T .“"79C 
/TO O TH PASTE 49

CEDRIN a  59ci
PILLSBURY w / i c i n g  
C IN N A M O NC IN N A M O N  A  i f f .

R O LLS  2 -.' 4 5 0
B O N O W A R f  9 ” -  ^

P A P E R  P L A T E S  690
____________________ 1 00-C t P k y  V  9

W H ITE S W A N  
P O R K  an d

Quality Meats

B EA N S 2  2 5 0

Cutlets .  - lb. 79c Pork Liver _ lb. 25c Hamburger _ 3 lb. $1 Slab Bacon .  lb. 65c l Bulk Franks _ lb. 35c
B A M A  R I D  P L U M  or  4 *

G A A P E  J A M  29C

H U N T S
CATSUP 14-0,. BottU
BLUE BO N N ET WHIPPED
MARGARINE c.
W HITFIELD FRESH KO SHER D IL I A

PICKLES O u a rl 3  f  •
W HITE SW A N  f  fk f ,
MUSTARD 16-0*. Jar I y C

RED SEAL 4  I n n  a  1 0 0
POTATO STIXOc.n.5!
W A PCO  CUT O  i n  . O I a

GREEN BEANs2c.°n.Olv
IIO U IO  2 2 -O x . C C APALMOLIVE P la s t ic
BAM A 18-O s. Tum bUr i A i
PEANUT BUTTER 4 V 0

PRICES G000 THROUGH SATURDAY. SEPTEMBER 2

Free Delivery Any Time —  30 Day Charge Accounts Invited

Pagels Store

Sister Silvaria 
Feted by Family

Sister Silvaria has ended a 
visit with her parents and fam­
ily the Raymond Zimmerers 
and with other relatives in 
Muenster and Lindsay and has 
gone to Little Rock, Ark., to 
teach at Holy Souls School. 
She taught at Benton, Ark., 
last year.

During her visit her par­
ents hosted a get-together of 
the Flusche family with a 
buffet supper at their home. 
Over 50 relatives attended the 
Sunday event.

Another day, Sister Silvaria, 
her sister Linda, their mother 
and two small nephews and 
grandsons, David and Anthony 
Zimmerer, spent the day in 
Wichita Falls with the Ray 
Zimmerers Jr., and Friday 
Sister Silvaria and a group of 
family members visited Six 
Flags.

Relatives at the reunion in­
cluded the honoree’s uncles 
and aunts, Messrs, and Mmes. 
Lawrence and Conrad Fiusche 
of Decatur, Joe J. Neu and 
Lawrence Zimmerer of Lind­
say, Henry Henscheid, Gus 
Lutkenhaus and children and 
Paul Fetsch and family.

Also cousins, Father Hubert 
Neu of Arlington, Messrs, and 
Mmes. Joe Simeroth and chil­
dren of Fort Worth, James 
Bayer of Valley View, Ray­
mond Hoenig of Irving, Joe 
Schmidlkofer of Lindsay and 
Johnny Kubicek of Gainesville 
and Misses Evelyn and MonicaExcellent Food Properly Served
The CURTWOOD  

CURTWOOD Jr. 
The COLONIAL

Curtis Restaurants

Fetsch of Denton.
Also Miss Frances Bernauer 

of Decatur, the Ray Zimmerers 
Jr. of Wichita Falls, the Rich­
ard Zimmerers and sons of 
Grapevine and Leonard Hack­
er.

Andrew Flusche called con­
gratulations from Dallas.

lose Weight Safely
wilh Dex-A-Diet Tablets 

Only 98T at
WATTS BROTHERS

Gainesville

PERFECTION

M&S DAIRY & FARM CENTER
415 N. Interstate 35. HO5-9082. Gainesville

FARM AUTOMATION SPECIALIST 
“Time Is Money — Let Us Save You Both"

B E R N A R D  S I C K I N G
Muenster, 817-759-2598. Gainesville 817-H05-6823

ALL THE WATER YOU NEED
with a JENSEN

Y o u  c a n  n o w  
have all the con- 
v e n ie n c e s  o f 
m o d e rn  liv in g  
when you install 
a Jensen Auto* 
m a l ic  W a t e r  
System. 17 sizes 
to choose from 
—  one for every 
home, ranch or 
farm need. It's 
the sensible way 
to get efficient, 
low-cosi w ater 
pumping.

C. D. Shamburger Lumber Co.
Dick Trachta, Mgr., Muenster

I. R. A.  Championship

Sanctioned by International Rodeo Assn.

Featuring some of the nation's top cowboys and cowgrils. 

Sponsored by Nocona Jaycees

Bareback Bronc Riding 
Steer Wrestling 
Calf Roping 
Brahma Bull Riding 
Barrel Racing 
$450 Added Money 
$20 Entry Fee

PLUS RODEO ENTERTAINMENT 

Red Gordon's Rodeo Band 

George Taylor Rodeo Clown and Specialty Acts

Chisholm Trail Round-up
Nocona, Texas

Aug. 31, Sept. 1, 2, 4
S C H E D U L E

Thursday, Aug 31
4 p.m. Trophy Parade 
6 p.m. Barbecue ($1.00)
8 p.m. First Performance

Friday, Sept. 1
8 p.m. Second Performance

Saturday, Sept. 2
1 p.m. Horseback Treasure Hunt 
8 p.m. Third Performance

Sunday, Sept. 3
7 p.m. Horseback Church Service 

(Lake Nocona)
Riding Club Camp Out

Monday, Sept. 4
(Labor Day)

7 a.m. Trail Breakfast
(Lake Nocona)

9 a.m. Trail Drive 
Noon Barbecue ($1.00)
4 p.m. Parade
8 p.m. Final Performance

—

ups-
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Holes in Swiss cheese are 

formed by gasses that result 
from fermentation.

, New 
big-screen

size for
family
viewing
1968

The VERMEER 
Y4206W

Compact table model television. 
Vinyl clad metal cabinet in 
grained Walnut color. Zenith 
quality 6" oval twin-cone speaker. 
Telescoping Dipole Antenna 
for VHF reception.

iZi $459.95
Other models 

priced from $369.95

HANDCRAFTED for
unrivaled dependability
Zenith High Performance 
Handcrafted Chassis—
No Printed Circuits . . .
No Production Shortcuts! Hand- 
wired for unrivaled dependability. 
Exclusive Zenith Super Gold 
Video Guard Tuning System for 
ultra sensitive reception, longer 
TV life, and greater picture 
stability.

Zenith Rectangular Sunshine* 
Color Picture Tube— for greater 
picture brightness with redder 
reds, brighter greens, and 
more brilliant blues.

ffNITH
The quality goes in 

before the name goes on*

MUENSTER 
BUTANE

759-4411, Muenster

Sister Regina Has 
Visits with Kin

While Sister Regina Koelzer 
of Deal, N. J., was a visitor 
here recently, guest of her sis­
ter, Mrs. John Herr and fam­
ily, a number of get-togethers 
were held and relatives were 
in and out for visiting. Accom­
panying Sister Regina was her 
sister, Mrs. Elbert Vance of 
Hereford.

Mrs. Earl Sheppard and chil­
dren Earl Jr. and Debbie came 
from Dallas and the group 
spent the day with the Leo­
nard Bengforts at Lindsay.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Endres 
took Sister Regina to Dallas 
to see her off by jet at Love 
Field for Baltimore where she 
was met by a niece and fam­
ily, Lt. and Mrs. Don Wilson, 
Bobby and Danny who showed 
her around at Aberdeen Prov­
ing Grounds, Maryland, and 
took her to Deal, N. J., where 
she will teach this year.

Ice Cream Party 
For Amarillo Kin

Surprise visitors driving up 
at the Victor Koelzer home 
Monday evening were her 
cousins Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Wink and son Lloyd of Ama­
rillo.

Telephone c a l l s  brought 
Lindsay and Muenster rela- 

| tives over with ice cream 
freezers and while they visited 
they made ice cream, then 
visited some more at refresh­
ment time.

Others present were Mr. 
I Wink’s uncle and aunt, Mr. 
I and Mrs. Leo Neusch and 
Clarence Neusch, the Herbert 
Schmidlkofers and children 
and the Frank Haverkamps 
Sr., all of Lindsay, the Joe 
Mosters and the H a r o l d  
Knabes and their children.

Before starting back home 
Tuesday the Winks drove to 
Lindsay for a pop call with the 
Lawrence Neusch family who 
were not able to attend the 
Monday night party.

Milners Reunion 
Has All Present

Sunday was a happy day for 
Mr. and Mrs. M. F. Milner. 
It was the first time they had 
all the family together at the 
same time since they have five 
grandchildren.

Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Mil­
ner and sons John and Marc 
are on vacation from Toledo, 
Ohio, and Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Haynes Jr. and children Marie, 
David and Kenneth of Euless 
joined them for the day.

The Lawrence Milners also 
visited her parents at Sherman 
and will go from here later 
this week to Hurst to visit her 
brothers and to Euless for a 
visit with the Haynes fam­
ily before starting back home.

Local members of the Ben 
Luke clan, joined by Father 
Eugene Luke of Subiaco, the 
Harold Lukes of Arlington and 
the Bernard Lukes of Irving, 
were together for a picnic sup­
per in the city park Saturday 
evening. Guests of local kin 
for three days before that were 
Tim, Chris and Peggy of the 
Harold Lukes.

OftLLAft

A contemporary two 
piece charmer 
fashioned in a rib 
textured 100% Acri- 

X  Ion acrylic.

The perfect addition 
to any wardrobe.

Sizes: 1 0 - 2 0

Colors: Camel, Blue, 
Green, Brick.

$20.00

^ J k e  Q U o t u t t  S h o p

Pearl Evans, Muenster

Mrs. John Fette, 90 
Feted on Birthday

Ninetieth birthday of Mrs. 
John Fette, 62-year resident 
of Muenster, was celebrated 
Friday evening at a dinner 
party at Rohmer’s Restaurant. 
Four generations of children,

grandchildren and their fam­
ilies and other relatives in­
cluding the Lambert Bezners 
of Gainesville and three gene­
rations of the Ratliff family 
were present.

The Ratliffs attending were 
Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Ratliff and 
son Sam of Lubbock, the Mike

Ratliffs of Norman and the 
Dan Ratliffs and five children 
of Houston. Mrs. C. W. Ratliff 
is the former Miss Margie 
Fette.

Also present were relatives 
from Illinois, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Cullingan of Moline.

A birthday cake, completely

covered with candles, and gifts 
for the 90-year honoree, in­
cluding red roses and carna­
tions, were part of the cele­
bration.

Mrs. Joe Lehnertz, sister-in- 
law of the honor guest, cut 
the cake and served it to 35

present.
Mrs. Fette has been a Muen­

ster resident since 1905, com­
ing with her husband from 
Iowa. He died in September 
1962 and she makes her home 
with her daughter, Mrs. Ben 
Seyler.

1 We Will Close 
On Labor Day

Decker's quartersMargarine, lb. pkg. .
Kraft'sVelveeta Cheese, 2 lb.
Heinz strainedBaby Food _ _ _ _
Libby's, No. 303Garden Sweet Peas _Hi C Drinks, 46 oz. _
Del MonteCatsup, 20 oz. .  .  _ .  3 -89c
Charmin, asst, colorsTissue .  .

.  3 -49c.. $1.09.  6 -59c5 - $1.00 .  3 -89c
_______4

Pard, 15 Mi oz.. beef flavoredCanned Dog Food .
SnowdriftShortening, 3 lb. can _
Hour after Hour. $1.00 sizeSpray Deodorant _ _

rolls 35c . 2 -29c .  .  69c .  .  79c

M eoid
Arm or Chuck

ROAST
from home fed and 

home killed beeflb. 59cPork Roast lb. 49cPork Steaklb. 59c
Decker's all meatFranks _.... lb. 49c

F R E E
19/500

Buccaneer Stamps
will be given at a drawing 
to be held Saturday, Sept. 2 

at Fisher's

1st prize, 10,000 stamps 
2nd prize, 5,000 stamps 
3rd prize, 2,000 stamps 
4th prize, 1,000 stamps 
5th prize, 1,000 stamps 
6th prize, 500 stamps

JUST REGISTER 
You don't have to buy.

For persons 18 years and over, please.

Pdxuiuce
1 lb. bag, Calif.Carrots____ 2-19c

Colorado

C A B B A G Elb. 5c
No. 1 Colo. Russet

P O T A T O E S10 lb. 59c
FREEBath Towel

with purchase of

B R E E Z E
25c off labelKing size $1.14

Wednesday Is 
Double Stamp Day
You get twice the usual number of Buccaneer 

Stamps on Wednesday with the purchase of 
$5.00 or more in groceries. (Cigarettes not in­
cluded.)

Ice Box Wantedold fashioned wood box top loader
doyenLemonade, Shurfine, 6 oz. .  10c

ShurfineStrawberries, lb. _ .  .  2 - 75c
Shurfine, 10 oz.Turnip Greenswith Diced Turnips .  2 - 29c

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

3 cans Del Monte, 46 oz. 
Tomato Juice

Void after Saturday, September 2

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

2 - Vz gal. bottles 
Clorox Bleach

Void after Saturday, September 2

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

3 - No. Vz cans 
Haase's White Tuna

Void after Saturday, September 2

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 bottle, $1.19 size 
Listerine Antiseptic

Void after Saturday, September 2

Redeem this coupon for
100 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 - 98c bottle Luster Cream 
Liquid Shampoo

Void after Saturday, September 2

Redeem this coupon for

50 FREE Buccaneer Stamps
plus reg. earned stamps on purchase of

1 - 5 lb. box 
Lightcrust Flour

Void after Saturday, September 2

G O O D  BEEFfor your freezer
from creep fed 

home killed calves 
whole or half carcass.

Phone 759-4211FISHER'S MFIllSTED
MARKET & GROCERY

4
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CLASSIFIED A D  RATES 
First insertion 15 cents per line.

M inim um  75 cents. 
F ollow ing insertions 10 cents per 
line. M inim um  50 cents.

D ISPLAY CLASSIFIED
First In se r t io n ________ per in. $1.00
Standing A d ............... ...  per in. 70c

Card o f  Thanks $1.00 
LEG AL NOTICE RATES 

First insertion 2 cents per word. 
F ollow ing insertions 1 cent per 
w ord.

THANKS
Many thanks for all kind 

and thoughtful deeds and re­
membrances of friends while 
I was in Muenster Hospital. 
Thanks to the hospital staff for 
their care and concern. My 
family is grateful too.

—Mrs. Harry Otto.

FOR SALE
Hens for Sale

3 for $1.00 
Thomas Sicking

759-4338, Muenster (41-1)
FOR SALE: 9 ft., all metal, 

single axle stock trailer. Jerry 
Hoenig, Ph. 759-2724. 40-tf

ANTIQUE ORGAN 
FOR SALE

Call after 5 p m. 759-4255
40-2Last 3 Days of our 2 for 1

S A L E
Many items 

2 for the price of 1.

Many items 
specially priced.

W e'll be open 
Sunday. Sept. 3Watts Bros.
Gene Watts, Bill Cypert 

Gainesville

Fire Extinguishers
for auto, truck and home 

now at
Community Lumber Co.

PRE FINISHED 
P A N E L I N G

in stock at
Community Lumber Co.

FOR SALE: Stocker calves, 
250 to 350 pounds. Call 759- 
4123 or see Chris Cain, Muen­
ster. 31-tf

COMPLETE septic tank and 
back hoe service. Ray Amoroso 
Phone day or night H05-4163, 
119 Cloud St. Gainesville. 35-8p

Used Furniture
Living Room Suite 
3 p iece________________ $40.00

2 Hollywood Style 
Single Beds. ea. $15.00

Several Used 
Dinettes, ea. $17.50

Double Bed complete
with mattress and
spring ______ $25.00

Good choice of 
Used Chairs

Hess
Furniture Co.

WINDOW SHADES, plastic or 
without rol.ers, plastic or 
Clopay. Washable, cut to your 
size. Ben Franklin Store. 31tf

MOTORS, all sizes, for milk­
ing machines, water pumps, 
oil field equipment, etc. C. D. 
Shamburger Lumber Co. 43tf

SHOE REPAIRS 
Cavalier & Esquire polish 

in all popular shades. 
Nick & Adelina Miller 48tf

Water Pumps
Submersible 

>/. H.P. to 40 H.P.

Plastic Pipe
A very inexpensive 
way to get water 
where you need it.

C. D. Shamburger 
Lumber Co.

Muenster

ORGAN FOR SALE: Spinet 
Hammond. Wonderful bargain 
at $550. Call evenings 894-2802. 
Mrs. John M. Murray, Mon­
tague. 39tf

MATTRESSES.
BOX SPRINGS 

New or Renovated
Baby mattresses to king size. 

Work guaranteed 
and all cotton felted.

Easy terms available.
Call your Representative 

MRS. TONY HOENIG 
Phone 759-4142

New and Used Steel
Used pipe, rods, channel, 

derrick legs, ladders and an­
gle. New tubing. 12, 14 & 16 
gauge sheet metal. Bulk feed­
ers, creep feeders, feed bunks, 
gates and angle fence posts. 
Portable and shop welding. 
Henry Popp, 2 mi. N. of Lind­
say. H05-9919. 26tf

FOOT POWDER foF~burn- 
ing, aching, itching, blistered 
feet and cracks between toes. 
Quickly helps stop over-pers­
piration. Nick & Adelina Shoe 
Repair Shop. 28tf

NORTHERN^HOLSTEIN 
SPRINGER HEIFERS 

Also tractors, combines and 
other farm machinery.

Bruno Zimmerer. 736-2212
50-tf

Call
Dan Luke 
759-2522

FOR

BUTANE 
PROPANE 
FINA GAS 
FINA OIL

MUFFLERS AND 
SHOCK ABSORBERS 

INSTALLED

Brakes Relined 
Tires

for tractors, implements, 
cars and trucks

Tom's Fina Station
Muenster O

Baler Wire 
Baler Twine 
W eed Spray

Tony's Seed & 
Feed. Inc.

Muenster

Cleaning your carpets with 
a vacuum claaner?

Rent or buy an electric Hoover 
carpet sweeper and see the dif­
ference.

Shampooer for rent
USE BISSEL SHAMPOO 
HESS FURNITURE CO.

GLASS: Plate, window, auto­
mobile, furniture tops, mirrors. 
Complete glass service. We 
handle insurance claims. Gain­
esville Glass Shop. H05-3321, 
311 N. Chestnut. 37tf

CONCRETE WORK: Any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish 
ready mix concrete. Bayer 
Brothers. 28tf

Let us 
supply your 

Fertilizer
Stockmen's Feed Store 

Muenster

Hudgins 
Sewing Circle

309 E. Calif., H05-2542 
Gainesville

SALES AND SERVICE
on all makes of 

sewing machines and 
vacuum cleaners.

Shoes —  Boots
Work - Dress - Western

Nocona Boots 
J. R. Hocker

Men's & Boys' Store
207 N. Commerce 

Gainesville

TANKS. Septic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks, water tanks. 
Will install. Bayer Bros. Phone 
759-4244, Muenster. 6tf

WANTED-------------------------------------------
SALES PERSON Needed to 

sell superior line of cosmetics. 
Contact Mary Gilliland, 415 
Ritchey St. Gainesville, H05- 
5750. 40-2

SALESMAN WANTED
KNAPP SHOE COMPANY 

will Franchise qualifying sales­
man, part-time or full-time. 
Liberal Commissions, Monthly 
Bonus, Free Insurance, No 
Merchandise Investment. Sell 
with Non-conflicting lines. In­
experienced Considered. Lynn 
Stokes, Box 24622, Dallas, Tex­
as. 40-3p

COOK WANTED
At Center Coffee Shop

759-2922 39tf
HELP WANTED

Good reliable and experi­
enced well service machine 
operator and two man crew. 
Past reference needed. 6 days 
a week. Crews rotate Sundays. 
Good pay and equipment. 
Need men willing to work 50 
to 60 hours a week. Grewing 
Bros. Well Service. Contact 
Richard or Walter at yard of­
fice, W. 6th St. Muenster. (26tf)

REAL ESTATE
FOR SALE OR RENT: house 

at 412 N. Maple. Modem, well 
kept, floor furnace, hardwood 
floors. Joe Luke, Ph. 759-2564.

41tf
FOR SALE: J. W. Hess Estate 
house at 802 N. Main. Shown 
by appointment. A1 Hess.

33tf
Realtor

Bonded real estate broker 
qualified to act as agent for 
sales or rentals.
759-2257, Muenster State Bank 

Henry G. Weinzapfel 
759-4161, 630 Weinzapfel St. O

Milk for human consumption 
is obtained from the cow, goat, 
reindeer, yak, zebu, buffalo, 
camel, llama and sheep.

FOR RENT
FARM HOUSE for rent. On 

all-weather road. See Mrs. 
Werner Endres or phone 759- 
4461. 41tf

HOUSE FOR RENT 
409 N. Walnut 
Phone 759-4227

40-3
FOR RENT

Store building east side of 
Main St. Call 759-4412 or 759- 
2257. 39tf

FOR RENT: 5-room house, 
newly redecorated and 4-room 
house, furnished, bills paid. 
See J. C. Trachta at Palace 
Drug. 37tf

SERVICE
Baby Silling

in my home for working 
mothers, daytime. See 

Mrs. Arthur Hennigan 
Second St, Muenster (41-2p)

Save on Hay Making
Let me mow, crimp and 

windrow with modern hay 
conditioner.
Tommy Knabe, 759-2884 (31-tf)

CUSTOM SPRAYING 
Anything, Anywhere 

Muenster Hatchery, 759-2766
CERAMIC TILE. New and 

old installation. For estimate 
call Ted Henscheid, 759-4280, 
Muenster. 5tf

W atch Repairs
Every watch is 

Ultrasonically Cleaned 
& Electronically Timed

Koesler Jewelry

Shotgun Shells 
(12 gauge)

AUTO SERVICE ON:
AIR CONDITIONERS 
BRAKES, MUFFLERS 
General Maintenance 
and Tune-Up Work

Bob's Gulf Station
Muenster, 759-2911 28tf

TV, Radio and 
Antenna Service

CALL
Schad & Pulte

H05-4374Registered Technician
Trained by Carnation 

Top dairy & beef bulls 
Call Gary Hess, 759-4335 

After 8:30 a.m. call 759-4360

Cleaning 
& Pressing

We pick up and deliver
NICK 8c ADELINA

Ph. 759-4422, Muenster

Westinghouse 
Appliances 

& Zenith TVs
Sales and Service

Radio & TV Repair 
Muenster Butane

Ph. 759-4411

Annual treat for NTPA em­
ployees, their wives or dates, 
was a dinner dance in the Par­
ish Hall Thursday. About 80 
attended the fried chicken din­
ner prepared by Mrs. Joe 
Lehnertz, and danced to music 
by Norbert Koesler and his 
band.

BEFORE BUYING 
INSURANCE

. . .  it is important to know ii 
your agent will be available to 
assist you on claim settlements. 
WE WILL!

For professional insurance service see

Weinzapfel Insurance Agency
Herbert Meurer - J. M. Weinzapfel - Earl Fisher 

Representing only the old line stock companies

Cooke
Attend

County Junior College 
This Fall

Students are invited to the 
college between now and 
registration date for sched­
ule planning.

FRESHMAN ORIENTATION
September 12

SOPHOMORE REGISTRATION
September 13

FRESHMAN REGISTRATION
September 14

Classes Begin
September 15

Many night courses are scheduled for veterans and 
other adults who want to continue their education. 

Limited dormitory accomodations available.

Cooke County Junior College
Highway 51, Gainesville, Texas 

Telephone H05-3476

Dependable 
Grinding & Mixing

BULK FEED SERVICE“M-M” Quality Feeds
SEED GRAIN FERTILIZER

MUENSTER MILLING CO.

TRAVEL
North Texas Travel Bureau

Escorted or Independent 
Tours-Trips-Land-Sea-Air 

All Airline and 
Hotel Reservations 
No Service Charge 

Phone H05-6007 
If no answer, Ph. H05-3911

38-8

Brown-eyed Miss Peggi Nes- 
ter of San Antonio is 1967-68 
Miss Texas Rural Electrifica­
tion. The 21-year-old San An­
tonio College sophomore was 
selected from six finalists dur­
ing the 27th Annual Meeting 
of Texas Electric Cooperative, 
Inc., in Houston August 17. 
She succeeds Miss Laura Gass 
of Comfort as the official am­
bassadress of Texas’ 79 rural 
electric systems and their 400,- 
000-plus members. She will al­
so be Texas’ nominee for the 
national Miss Rural Electrifi­
cation title in Dallas in Feb­
ruary, 1968. She’s the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Ivan Nester 
of Dunlay, Medina County. 
She was Miss Fiesta of San 
Antonio last year. In college, 
she’s majoring in elementary 
education.

Mrs. Bruno Fleitman and 
daughters Misses Sara, Blon- 
die and Janie left Sunday for 
Denver, Colo., where Blondie 
stayed at Loretta Heights Col­
lege, returning for her junior 
year. The other three will be 
back here the latter part of the 
week.

Local NewsB R I E F S
Gary Barrier who visited his 

grandparents Mr. and Mrs. W. 
L. Scoggins at Myra and uncle 
Harry Scoggins and family 
here has returned to Marine 
training in San Diego. The 
grandparents and the Harry 
Scoggins family saw him off 
at Love Field Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Julian Wal- 
terscheid have named their in­
fant son Kyle Ray. He was 
baptized Sunday by Father Al- 
cuin. Mr. and Mrs. Amie Mul­
ler attended as godparents for 
their grand-nephew.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Derichs- 
weiler had their children and 
grandchildren at their home 
last Sunday for a family gath­
ering with dinner at noon. At­
tending were the Bill Crows 
and family of Archer City, the 
Irven Derichsweilers and chil­
dren of Lewisville, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dale Hess and children 
of Lewisville, the Richard 
Zimmerers and sons of Grape­
vine, the Fred Knabes and 
children and the Gene Sch- 
mitzes and sons. Earl Schlabs 
of Scotland accompanied the 
Crow family.

Brother Charles McGannon, 
CSC, of Long Beach, Calif., 
visited his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Edd McGannon and other 
family members on his recent 
vacation. Before coming to 
Muenster he spent four days 
with his sister, Mrs. Gordon 
Lins and family at Kansas 
City, Mo. While here he went 
to Bowie to see friends and 
to Wichita Falls to visit with 
Holy Cross Brothers. He left 
by jet from Dallas Friday 
night returning to Long Beach 
to resume teaching at St. An­
thony High School. He also 
coaches junior basketball. Last 
year his team was undefeated 
for the first time in the 35- 
year history of the school. Dur­
ing the summer he taugh at 
Sherman Oaks, Calif.

Family Gathering 
Observes Feastday

A feastday observance hon­
ored Bishop Augustine Dan- 
glmayr Sunday evening at the 
home of his nephew and niece, 
the Paul Dangelmayrs who 
entertained with a dinner 
party for family members. 
Mrs. Billy Joe Dangelmayr as­
sisted with hostess duties.

Another niece, Mrs. Donnie 
Trubenbach, baked and decor­
ated a cake and lettered it 
with “Happy Feastday.”

Others present were Mr. and 
Mr s .  Herman Dangelmayr, 
Billy Joe Dangelmayr and chil­
dren Janet and Tommy, Don­
na, Karl and Steve Trubenbach 
and the hosts’ sons Mike, Ron­
nie and Chris.

v x v x x x x x x x x xC U R L E E  
LOTHES Jx x

x x v x x x x y x X X X

H A M R I C ' S
The place to go 

for brands you know.

Ray’s Drive-In
GROCERYLabor Day Week Specials

September 1 through 7 

CABELL'S DAIRY PRODUCTS
Pure Ice Cream, Vz g a l . .................... 79c
Buttermilk, q t .________   19c
Chocolate Milk, q t ._____________  19c
Cottage Cheese, lb. _____   19c

Keith's 2 lb. bag frozen
French Fried Potatoes ____________39c
Frozen Lemonade, 12 oz. .......... ......  25c
Morton's Frozen Dinners___  2 - 89c
Reg. 79c, large bag (70 or more)
Assorted C ookies_________________49c
Shortening, Our Value 69c
Barbecue Sauce, Kraft 18 oz. .... 39c 
Contac, reg. $1.49 size 99c
Revlon Hair Spray, large .......... . 59c
Zippers, 7 in., 9 in., 10 in .__________10c
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Kent Bellah Studio 

Saint Jo
Open 10 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Closed Sun., Mon., Tues.NewFallFashionsAreHere

. . .  including lots of 
lovely selections 

for back-to-3chool 
at budget prices.

W e greet the customer 
with a smile.The Band Box
Gainesville

Lufthansa 
Invitation to 

TOUR EUROPE
with

Aida Reinarz
Mrs. Reinarz, multilingual 

a n d  frequent international 
traveler, and a previous tour 
conductress,

Invites you
to tour HOLLAND, BERLIN, 
SWITZERLAND, ENGLAND, 
AUSTRIA, ITALY. FRANCE 
and V/EST GERMANY.

Depart October 4 
Return October 25

ONLY A FEW 
VACANCIES EXIST

For further information 
call

H05-6007 or H05 3911
Gainesville

Marysville News
By Mrs. John Richey

MARYSVILLE, Aug. 22 — 
Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Snow of 
Tawakoni returned their nieces 
and nephew, Becky, Barbara, 
Patricia, Kathy and Mike Da­
vidson to their home Friday 
and after a visit with the 
Charles Davidsons spent the 
weekend with Mrs. Snow’s 
parents, the W. F. Davidsons. 
The children had had a weeks 
vacation with their uncle and 
aunt. Mr. and Mrs. Snow took 
her parents home with them 
for an indefinite visit.

Danny, John Carter, Andrea 
and Douglas, children of Mr. 
and Mrs. Donny Whitt had a 
week’s vacation with their 
grandparents, the B u f o r d  
Whitts, while the parents mov­
ed from Grapevine to their 
new home in Collinsville. Mrs. 
Donny Whitt brought the 
children over last week Tues­
day and their grandmother 
took them to Collinsville this 
week Tuesday and remained 
overnight.

Mr. and Mrs. John Richey 
and Ross Ballinger were in 
Sulphur, Okla., Sunday at a 
f a m i l y  gathering honoring 
their aunt, Mrs. Inez Ballinger 
in observance of her 87th 
birthday which was Wednes­
day, Aug 23. Everyone at­
tending took a picnic dinner 
and had the reunion in the 
park. All of Mrs. Ballinger’s 
children, most of her grand­
children and great-grandchil­
dren, brothers, nieces and 
nephews attended. They came 
from Bethany, Ada, Pauls Val­
ley, Sulphur, Lawton and Wol- 
ters, Okla., Fort Worth and 
Gainesville. Mrs. Ballinger’s 
brothers are Leonard and 
Floyd Wyatt of Gainesville. 
Pictures were made.

Among rodeo fans at the 
Cooke County Fair Rodeo were 
Messrs, and Mmes. Tillman 
Bridges, R. D. Morris, Bill 
Moon, Lawton Moon, Travis 
Whitt, Ernest Robison, John 
Richey, Carles Davidson and 
children and their guests Mr. 
and Mrs. H. B. Snow of Ta­
wakoni, Mr. and Mrs. Buford 
Whitt and their visiting grand­
children, Andrea, Danny, John 
Carter and Douglas Whitt of 
Grapevine. The children were 
seeing their first live rodeo.

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Thomp­
son and children of Lawton,

!

BOOSTS WHEAT HEALTH, GROWTH 
and ROOT FORMATION-  
INCREASES YIELD.

Nipak’s new Premium Wheat 
Special, a homogeneous am­
monium phosphate fertilizer, 
contains the proper balance of 
nutrients to produce a vigorous, 
healthy plant that will stand 
better and produce more and 
better quality grain. These 
nutrients are:

NITROGEN ( f o r  g r o wt h ,  
color)

PHOSPHATE ( f o r  e a r l y  
root formation)

POTASH (for disease resis­
tance)

SULFUR (for added protein)

Nipak Premium Wheat'Special also contains other key nutrients 
essential to the production of chlorophyll, maximum grain and 
seed production, and general plant vigor.

For top yield and greater profits, apply 150 pounds 
of Nipak Premium Wheat Special at planting time 
and top dress with 100 pounds of Nipak Urea 
(45-0-0) per acre in late winter.

Superior yields begin with NIPAK FERTILIZERS

NIPAK, INC., P. 0. Box 2820/Dallas, Texas 75221

Nipak Fertilizer 
Sold By

Tony's Seed & Feed, Inc.
Muenster, Texas

WINNERS AND RUNNERS-UP in the 1967 Cooke County softball league received 
trophies in ceremonies at the ball park last Thursday night. Bell Telephone was the 
winner. Muenster Center, Bullard Supply and First State Bank tied for second spot. 
Pictured are Willie Walterscheid and Adam Wolf of the Center, J. C. Bullard and Dale 
Sowder of Bullard Supply, Weldon Turner and Deryl Barnes of First State Bank, Bob 
Carter and Tom Cozort of Bell Telephone. Gainesville Register Photo

Okla., visited here Friday with 
the Nathan Whitts and Jack 
Tuggles. They were enroute to 
Ardmore, Tenn., and Hunts­
ville, Ala., to visit relatives and 
took Nathan Whitt with them. 
This is the group’s second trip 
to Alabama this summer.

Weekending with the Char­
lie Winchesters were his cous­
ins, Mr. and Mrs. Herman 
Stanton of Madill, Okla. Join­
ing them Sunday was a sister 
and cousin, Mrs. Lloyd Barn­
hart of Gainesville.

The Weldon Doughty family 
of Euless visited Sunday with 
his parents, the Joe Dough- 
tys. Driving over for a Sat­
urday evening visit and sup­
per were another son and fam­
ily, the Sheldon Doughtys of 
Valley View.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hick­
man of Irving returned their 
granddaughter Nancy Hick­
man of her home Saturday and 
spent over Sunday with their 
son and family, the Milton 
Hickmans. Nancy had spent a 
week’s vacation with her 
grandparents and also visited 
other relatives in Dallas. Ac­
companying her home to spend 
a week was a cousin Bobby 
McWilliams of Dallas.

Mrs. O. C. Ingram of Bums 
City spent Monday and Tues­
day with her daughter and 
family, the Grady McElreaths 
Visiting in the McElreath home 
three days last week was a 
niece, Miss Rhonda Branch of 
Gainesville. Brother Aubrey 
Spires of Gainesville had Sun­
day dinner with the McEl­
reaths.

Mrs. John Richey visited 
Mrs. Alys Graye at Chaffin 
Rest Home in Gainesville Mon­
day.

Mrs. Nathan Whitt spent 
part of this week in Gaines­
ville with her daughter Mrs. 
L. V. Aiken and family who 
took her along after their 
visit here Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. R. D. Morris 
are rejoicing over the birth 
of another grandchild, Pamela 
Lucille Grober, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Grober and 
sister of Ronny, Penny and 
Patti of Tulsa, Okla. She join­
ed the family Aug. 16.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Myers of 
Davis, Okla., spent Thursday 
and Friday with Mr. and Mrs. 
R. D. Morris and they all at­

tended the Gainesville Rodeo 
Thursday night. Friday they 
went to Sivells Bend to see 
their old home place, now 
owned by the Cloy Mobleys. 
Other visitors arriving Friday 
were Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hobbs 
of Plainview and the Morrises 
went to the Gainesville Rodeo 
with them. Saturday Mr. and 
Mrs. Morris took Mr. and Mrs. 
Hobbs to Waco to visit rela­
tives. They will have another 
visit at the Morris home before 
returning to Plainview.

Voice on telephone: “How 
are you doing this morning?” 

“Just fine.”
“O, I must have the wrong 

number.”

Sanders Jewelry
107 S. Commerce, G'ville

THIS WEEK’ S 
KEY VALUE

B E N f F R A N  KLI INI
Tony Luke, Muenster

mm:

PUBLIC NOTICE
Proposed CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENT

NUMBER THREE ON THE BALLOT
HOUSE JOINT RESOLU­

TION No. 17 proposing an 
amendment to Section 49-b, 
Article III of the Constitution 
of Texas, b o  as to authorize 
an increase in the total amount 
of bonds or obligations that 
may be issued by the Veterans’ 
Land Board to Four Hundred 
Million Dollars ($400,000,000); 
providing for the issuance of 
said bonds or obligations and 
the conditions relating thereto 
and the use of the Veterans’ 
Land Fund; and providing for 
an election and the issuance of 
a proclamation therefor.
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE 

LEGISLATURE OF THE 
STATE OF TEXAS:
Section 1. That Section 49-b, 

Article III of the Constitution 
of Texas, be amended so that 
the same will hereafter read 
as follows:

“ Section 49-b. By virtue of 
prior Amendments to this 
Constitution, there has been 
created a governmental agency 
of the State of Texas perform­
ing governmental duties which 
has been designated the Vet­
erans’ Land Board. Said Board 
shall continue to function for 
the purposes specified in all 
of the prior Constitutional 
Amendments except as modi­
fied herein. Said Board shall 
be composed of the Commis­
sioner of the General Land Of­
fice and two (2) citizens of 
the State of Texas, one (1) of 
whom shall be well versed in 
veterans’ affairs and one (1) 
of whom shall be well versed 
in finances. One (1) such citi­
zen member shall, with the ad­
vice and consent of the Sen­
ate, be appointed biennially by 
the Governor to serve for a 
term of four (4) years; but the 
members serving on said Board 
on the date of adoption hereof 
shall complete the terms to 
which they were appointed. In 
the event of the resignation or 

; death of any such citizen mem- 
I ber, the Governor shall ap- 
f point a replacement to serve 
! lor the 'in expired portion of 

the term to which the de- 
■ eaLeU or resigning member 
had Lcen appointed. The com- 

; pensation for said citizen mem­
bers hall be as is now or may 
hereafter be fixed by the 
legislature; and each shall 

1 make bond in such amount as 
! is now or may hereafter be 

prescribed by the Legislature. 
“The Commissioner of the 

j General Land Office shall act 
! as Chairman of said Board
* and shall be the administrator 

of the Veterans’ Land Pro-
I gram under such terms and re-
• strictions as are now or may 
I hereafter be provided by law. 
| In the absence or illness of 
. said Commissioner, the Chief

Clerk of the General Land Of- 
I fice shall be the Acting Chair- 
’ man of said Board with the 
i duties and powers that

.1 'lissioner would have 
‘ if present.

“The Veterans’ Land Board 
rnay provide for, issue and sell 
not to exceed Four Hundred 
Million Dollars ($400,000,000) 
in bonds or obligations of the 
otate of Texas for the purpose 
of creating a fund to be known 
as the Veterans’ Land Fund, 
Two Hundred Million Dollars 
($200,000,000) of which have 

I heretofore been issued and 
’ d. Such bonds or obligations 

H be sold for not less than

par value and accrued interest; 
shall be issued in such forms, 
denominations, and upon such 
terms as are now or may here­
after be provided by law; shall 
be issued and sold at such 
times, at such places, and in 
such installments as may be 
determined by said Board; and 
shall bear a rate or rates of 
interest as may be fixed by 
said Board but the weighted 
average annual interest rate, 
as that phrase is commonly 
and ordinarily used and under­
stood in the municipal bond 
market, of all the bonds issued 
and sold in any installment of 
any bonds may not exceed four 
and one-half per cent (4tt%). 
All bonds or obligations issued 
and Bold hereunder shall, after 
execution by the Board, ap­
proval by the Attorney Gen­
eral of Texas, registration by 
the Comptroller of Public Ac­
counts of the State of Texas, 
and delivery to the purchaser 
or purchasers, be incontestable 
and shall constitute general ob­
ligations of the State of Texas 
u n d e r  the Constitution of 
Texas; and all bonds hereto­
fore issued and sold by said 
Board are hereby in all re­
spects validated and declared 
to be general obligations of 
the State of Texas. In order to 
prevent default in the payment 
of principal or interest on any 
such bonds, the Legislature 
shall appropriate a sufficient 
amount to pay the same.

“In the sale of any such 
bonds or obligations, a pref­
erential right of purchase 
shall be given to the adminis­
trators of the various Teacher 
Retirement Funds, the Perm­
anent University Funds, and 
the Permanent School Funds.

“ Said Veterans’ Land Fund 
shall consist of any lands here­
tofore or hereafter purchased 
by said Board, until the sale 
price therefor, together with 
any interest and penalties due, 
have been received by said 
Board (although nothing here­
in shall be construed to pre­
vent said Board from accept­
ing full payment for a portion 
of any tract), and of the 
moneys attributable to any 
bonds heretofore or hereafter 
issued and sold by said Board 
which moneys so attributable 
shall include but shall not be 
limited to the proceeds from 
the issuance and sale of such 
bonds; the moneys received 
from the sale or resale of any 
lands, or rights therein, pur­
chased with such proceeds; the 
moneys received from the sale 
or resale of any lands, or 
rights therein, purchased with 
other moneys attributable to 
such bonds; the interest and 
penalties received from the 
sale or resale of such lands, 
or rights therein; the bonuses, 
income, rents, royalties, and 
any other pecuniary benefit re­
ceived by said Board from any 
such lands; sums received by 
way of indemnity or forfeiture 
for the failure of any bidder 
for the purchase of any such 
bonds to comply with his bid 
and accept and pay for such 
bonds or for the failure of any 
bidder for the purchase of any 
lands comprising a part of said 
Fund to comply with his bid 
and accept and pay for any 
such lands; and interest re­
ceived from investments of any 
such moneys. The principal and

interest on the bonds hereto­
fore and hereafter issued by 
sai** Board shall be paid out of 
the moneys of said Fund in 
conformance with the Consti­
tutional provisions authorizing 
such bonds; but the moneys of 
said Fund which are not im­
mediately committed to the 
payment of principal and in­
terest on suen bonds, the pur­
chase of lands as herein pro­
vided, or the payment of ex- 

nses as herein provided may 
invested in bonds or obli­

gations of the United States 
until such funds are needed for 
such purposes.

“All moneys comprising a 
part of said Fund and not ex­
pended for the purposes herein 
provided shall be & part of 
said Fund until there are suf­
ficient moneys therein to re­
tire fully all of the bonds here­
tofore or hereafter issued and 
sold by said Board, at which 
time all such moneys remain­
ing in said Fund, .except such 
portion thereof as may be 
necessary to retire all such 
bonds which portion shall be 
set aside and retained in said 
Fund for the purpose of re­
tiring all such bonds, shall be 
deposited to the credit of the 
General Revenue Fund to be 
appropriated to such purposes 
as may be prescribed by law. 
All moneys becoming a part of 
said Fund thereafter shall like­
wise be deposited to the credit 
of the General Revenue Fund.

“When a Division of said 
Fund (each Division consisting 
of the moneys attributable to 
the bonds issued and sold pur­
suant to a single Constitution­
al authorization and the lands 
purchased therewith) contains 
sufficient moneys to retire all 
of the bonds secured by such 
Division, the moneys thereof, 
except such portion as may be 
needed to retire all of the 
bonds secured by such Divis­
ion which portion shall be set 
aside and remain a part of 
such Division for the purpose 
of retiring all such bonds, may 
be used for the purpose of 
paying the principal and the 
interest thereon, together with 
the expenses herein authorized, 
cf any other bonds heretofore 
or hereafter issued and sold by 
said Board. Such use shall be a 
matter for the discretion and 
direction of said Board; but 
there may be no such use of 
any such moneys contrary to 
the rights of any holder of any 
of the bonds issued and sold 
by said Board or violative of 
any contract to which said 
Board is a party.

“The Veterans’ Land Fund 
shall be used by said Board 
for the purpose of purchasing 
lands situated in the State of 
Texas owned by the United 
States or any governmental 
agency thereof, owned by the 
Texas Prison System or any 
other governmental agency of 
the State of Texas, or owned 
by any person, firm, or cor­
poration. All lands thus pur­
chased shall be acquired at the 
lowest price obtainable, to be 
paid for in cash, and shall be 
a part of said Fund. Such 
lands heretofore or hereafter 
purchased and comprising a 
part of said Fund are hereby 
declared to be held for a gov­
ernmental purpose, although 
the individual purchasers there­
of shall be subject to taxation 
to the same extent and in the 
same manner as are purchas­
ers of lands dedicated to the 
Permanent Free Public School 
Fund.

“The lands of the Veterans’ 
Land Fund shall be sold by 
said Board in such quantities, 
on such terms, at such prices, 
at such rates of interest and 
under such rules and regula­
tions as are now or may here­
after be provided by law to 
veterans who served not less 
than ninety (90) continuous 
days, unless sooner discharged 
by reason of a service-con­
nected disability, on active 
duty in the Army, Navy, Air 
Force, Coast Guard or Marine 
Corps of the United States be­
tween September 16, 1940, and 
the date of formal withdrawal 
of United States troops from 
the present armed conflict in 
Viet Nam, and who, upon the 
date of filing his or her appli­
cation to purchase any such 
land is a citizen of the United 
States, is a bona fide resident 
of the State of Texas, and has 
not been dishonorably dis­
charged from any branch of 
the Armed Forces above- 
named and who at the time of 
his or her enlistment, induc­
tion, commissioning, or draft­
ing was a bona fide resident 
of the State of Texas, or who 
has resided in Texas at least 
five (6) years prior to the date 
of filing his or her applica­
tion. The foregoing notwith­
standing, any lands in the 
Veterans’ Land Fund which 
have been first offered for sale 
to veterans and which have not 
been sold may be sold or re­
sold to such purchasers, in 
such quantities, and on such 
terms, and at such prices and 
rates of interest, and under 
such rules and regulations as 
are now or may hereafter be 
provided by law.

"Said Veterans’ Land Fund, 
to the extent of the moneys 
attributable to any bonds here­
after issued and sold by said 
Board may be used by said 
Board, as is now or may here­
after be provided by law, for 
the purpose of paying the ex­
penses of surveying, monu- 
menting, road construction, 
legal fees, recordation fees, 
advertising and other like 
costs necessary or incidental 
to the purchase and sale, or re­
sale, of any lands purchased 
with any of the moneys at­
tributable to such additional 
bonds, such expenses to be 
added to the price of such 
lands when sold, or resold, by 
said Board; for the purpose 
of paying the expenses of is­
suing, selling, and delivering 
any such additional bonds; and 
for the purpose of meeting the 
expenses of paying the inter­
est or principal due or to be­
come due on any such addi­
tional bonds.

“All of the moneys attri­
butable to any series of bonds 
hereafter issued and sold by 
said Board (a ‘series of bonds’ 
being all of the bonds issued 
and sold in a single trans­
action as a single installment 
of bonds) may be used for the 
purchase of lands as herein 
provided, to be sold as herein 
provided, for a period ending 
eight (8) years after the date 
of sale of such series of 
bonds; provided, however, that 
so much of such moneys as may 
be necessary to pay interest on 
bonds hereafter issued and sold 
shall be set aside for that pur­
pose in accordance with the 
resolution adopted by said 
Board authorizing the issuance 
and sale of such series of 
bonds. After such eight (8) 
year period, all of suoh moneys 
shall be set asiae for the re­

tirement of any bonds here­
after issued and sold and to 
pay interest thereon, together 
with any expenses as provided 
herein, in accordance with the 
resolution or resolutions auth­
orizing the issuance and sale 
of such additional bonds, until 
there are sufficient moneys to 
retire all of the bonds here­
after issued and sold, at which 
time all such moneys then re­
maining a part of said Vet­
erans’ Land Fund and there­
after becoming a part of said 
Fund shall be governed as 
elsewhere provided herein.

“This Amendment being in­
tended only to establish a 
basic framework and not to be 
a comprehensive treatment of 
the Veterans’ Land Program, 
there is hereby reposed in the 
Legislature full power to im­
plement and effectuate the de­
sign and objects of this Amend­
ment, including the power to 
delegate such duties, responsi­
bilities, functions, and author­
ity to the Veterans’ Land 
Board as it believes necessary.

“ Should the Legislature en­
act any enabling laws in an­
ticipation of this Amendment, 
no such law shall be void by 
reason of its anticipatory na­
ture.

"This Amendment shall be­
come effective upon its adop­
tion."

Sec. 2. The foregoing con­
stitutional amendment shall be 
submitted to a vote of the 
qualified electors of this state 
at an election to be held on 
November 11, 1967, at which 
election all ballots shall have 
printed thereon the following: 

“ FOR the amendment to ex­
tend the Veterans’ Land 
Program by authorizing the 
sale of bonds to increase the 
Veterans’ Land Fund for the 
purpose of purchasing land 
in Texas to be sold to Texas 
veterans who served in the 
A r m e d  Services of the 
United States between Sep­
tember 16, 1940, and the 
date of formal withdrawal of 
United States troops from 
the present armed conflict in 
Viet Nam, which amendment 
would amend Section 49-b, 
Article III of the Constitu­
tion of Texas, and provide 
for an additional $200,000,- 
000 in bonds, such funds to 
be expended in accordance 
with instructions and re­
quirements that may be pro­
vided by law.”
“AGAINST the amendment 
to extend the Veterans’ Land 
Program by authorizing the 
sale of bonds to increase the 
Veterans’ Land Fund for the 
purpose of purchasing land 
in Texas to be sold to Texas 
veterans who served in the 
A r m e d  Services of the 
United States between Sep­
tember 16, 1940, and the date 
of formal withdrawal of 
United States troops from 
the present armed conflict in 
Viet Nam, which amendment 
would amend Section 49-b, 
Article III of the Constitu­
tion of Texas, and provide 
for an additional $200,000,- 
000 in bonds, such funds to 
be expended in accordance 
with instructions and re­
quirements that may be pro­
vided by law.”  q  
Sec. 3. The Governor of the 

State of Texes shall issue the 
necessary proclamation for the 
election and this amendment 
shall be published in the man­
ner and for the length of time 
as required by the Constitution 
and laws of this state.
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Endres Quartet 
Back from Trip

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Endres 
and daughters Misses Mary 
Ellen and Peggy Endres, are 
back from a 12-day trip that 
took them to Virginia^ Wash­
ington, D.C., and Illinois.

In Manassas, Va., they visit­
ed their daughter and sister 
and her husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lamar Owens and helped them 
celebrate their first wedding 
anniversary on August 20.

They toured Washington, 
D.C., several days seeing all 
the places of interest includ­
ing the Capitol and White 
House, saw the famous Thun- 
derbird Air Show given one

day at Dulles Air Port and 
visited Mount Vernon.

In Olney, 111., they visited 
Mrs. Endres’ sister and fam­
ily, the Charles Everettes, and 
on August 26 attended the 
wedding, of Thomas Everette, 
one of the twins, to Miss Mar­
garet Drone in St. Joseph’s 
Catholic Church at Ridgeway. 
The bridegroom is in the Navy 
and the young couple will be 
at home in San Francisco, 
Calif.

On return home the Endreses 
found daughter Karen back. 
She had a summer job in Aus­
tin and is packing to leave for 
Athens, Ga., where she will 
teach at the University of 
Georgia.

YES!
You can afford 
a New HomePlenty of money is available for low cost home construction with low payments costing no more than rent.

See us (or details
SHAMBURGER LUMBER CO .

Dick Trachta, Mgr., Muenster

Flowers for Every Occasion
Since 1884 It’s

KADEN, The Florist
Flowerphone H05-4354, Gainesville

Represented in Muenster by Mrs. Nick Miller

TOURNAMENT CHAMPS and runners- up receive trophies after their final game, 
which Muenster won 2-1 on a ninth inning homer by Tommy Herr. Shown are Herr 
and Alvin Hartman, Muenster pitcher, Bob Carter, tournament director, Billy Puckett, 
Bell Telephone pitcher and Tommy Carr, whose homer was Bell’s only run.

Gainesville Register Photo

FOR GOOD, LOW COST 
FIRE and STORM 

INSURANCE
Contact

Muenster Mutual 
Fire Insurance Association

Edward Endres, Secretary, 759-2305, Box 37, Muenster

Local News
B R I E F S

Sister Cynthia, daughter of 
the Paul Fishers, had a short 
visit one day last week with 
her parents and family — a 
stop-over enroute from Jones­
boro, Ark., to Rhineland where 
she is assigned again this year.

iiiiiiimiiiiiiiiiimIn All The World
No one is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you.

GEO. J .

Carroll
L  SON

Gary Krahl, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Martin Krahl of Valley 
View, has entered St. John’s 
Seminary in San Antonio. He 
is a freshman, a preparatory 
student for the priesthood. He 
received his elementary educa­
tion at St. Mary’s School in 
Gainesville.

Sister Ceciie visited Thurs­
day and Friday with her moth­
er, Mrs. R. R. Endres, driving 
over with a friend from Den­
ton where she had been at­
tending summer school at 
NTSU. She’ll teach in Dickin­
son again this year. Thursday 
night the family gathered at 
Mrs. Endres’ home for a re­
union honoring Sister Ceciie.

Business and pleasure were 
combined on a trip to Saint 
Paul, Minn., by Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Klement and Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Schilling on a five- 
day vacation the past week. 
They visited Mrs. Klement’s 
brothers and sisters a n d  
bought a load of Holstein milk 
cows.
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It was back to nurses train­
ing at St. Paul’s Hospital Mon­
day for Miss Debbie Schilling 
and Miss Judy Dangelmayr af­
ter a summer visit with their 
parents, the Frank Schillings 
and the Albert Dangelmayrs. 
The two girls had just re­
turned from a sight-seeing trip 
to New' Orleans with three 
classmates from Dallas. Fam­
ily members took them to 
Dallas Sunday.

"WHEW!
..IT'S BEEN HOT!"

“ A n d  I ’ v e  b e e n  r e a l l y  b u s y  k e e p i n g  y o u  f o l k s  c o o l ! "

Throughout most of Texas, it’s been another 
hot summer. But, in thousands of homes and 
businesses, Reddy Kilowatt and electric air 
conditioning have been on the job providing 
cool comfort.

So, if your electric service bill is higher, 
think of the many extra hours of work you’ve 
asked Reddy to perform.

Electricity is still the biggest bargain in your 
household budget!

A family get-together with 
a picnic supper in Muenster 
City Park last Sunday brought 
the Albert Henscheid family 
together. Attending with Mr. 
and Mrs. Henscheid were their 
eight children and 46 of their 
48 grandchildren. Only ones 
missing were a grandson fight­
ing in Vietnam and a grand­
daughter of Fort Worth.

Four generations of family 
were together Sunday at the 
home of Mrs. Will Sicking for 
a picnic dinner in the yard 
under the shade trees. Forty- 
four attended. The Ray Sick­
ing Family Band entertained 
after the meal. Mrs. Andy 
O’Connor was there later to 
join those who stayed for 
supper.

Mr. and Mrs. Willie Walter- 
scheid and sons Terry and Kim 
enjoyed a short vacation at 
Houston, Galveston and Bay- 
town. They toured the Astro­
dome and saw a ball game, 
went swimming in the Gulf, 
saw the Sea Arama and then 
stopped at Baytown for a visit 
with friends from Army days 
when the men were stationed 
at Fort Carson, Colo.

OPERATING COST OF AIR CONDITIONING*

Average Cost 
Per Ton

MAY JUNE JULY AUG. SEPT.

$1.60 $7.90 $12.60 $13.20 $4.90

•Bated on entlyti* ol electric air conditioning ute in the TP4L service ecea.

T E X A S  P O W E R  & L I G H T  C O M P A N Y•  tax-paying, investor-owned electric utility

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTINGFixturesSuppliesAppliances

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 
Installations, Repairs 

Appliance RepairsCall H05-2721
Nights call

H05-3263 or HO5-2204Parker Electric
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville

The Dan Hamrics had as I 
weekend guests, friends from I 
Monahans, the Tommy Cooks 
and daughter Xandra. Satur­
day the two families spent the 
day at Six Flags.

Sister Clare ended a visit j 
with her parents and family, 
the Leo Sickings, Sunday and 
went to Lake Arthur, La., 
where she will teach this year. 
Family get-togethers to see all 
the relationship honored Sister 
Clare during her stop-over 
here from Jonesboro, Ark., en­
route to her new assignment. 
She taught at Little Rock last 
year.

AN EXTRA SERVICE 
at no extra cost

You can see and 
feel the difference

Homogenizes vital 
textile oil back inio 

tne fabric
We Give

S&H Green Stamps

MILLER'S
Cleaners &  Hatters

Gainesville

Here’s
l o

our 
American 
Labor...

. .  .whose large-scale achievements and bene­
fits are among the greatest known to the work­
ing forces of the modern world!

In observance of
L A B O R  DAY

our bank w ill not conduct business on 
M onday, September 4.

Deposits insured up to $15,000Muenster State Bank
Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

First down 
Five to go

Beer aiter beer— the choicest product of the brewers'art*. Everywhere.

Falstaff Brewing Corp., St. look. Mo.

Savings Accounts Insured up to $15,000
by the Federal Savings & Loan Insurance Corp. 

ALL SAVINGS IN BY THE 10th EARN FROM THE Is-

M W I T C O MI F E M B I B M i
AAV1NGB f  LOAN AM OCUnON/EUI AT M'HNNIY /  DfNTDN. TIXa#

v. ' v;;.. *.■ . * ■
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C ecilia Zimmerer 
Francis Novacek 
M arry a t Lindsay

—Boyd and Breeding Photo

St. Peter’s Church was the 
scene of wedding ceremonies 
Saturday at 5 p.m. uniting Miss 
Cecilia Zimmerer, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. John F. Zim­
merer of Lindsay, and Francis 
J. Novacek, son of Mrs. John 
A. Novacek of Dwight, Neb., 
and the late Mr. Novacek.

Father Alcuin Kubis, Muen- 
ster pastor, a cousin of the 
bride, officiated at Nuptial 
Mass and double ring service.

Presented by her father, the 
bride wore a gown of candle­
light peau de soie designed on 
slim lines with Empire bodice 
and Venise lace accents. The 
skirt gathered fullness to the 
back with folds flowing into 
a chapel train. She carried 
cymbidium orchids and steph- 
anotis.

Miss Dorothy Zimmerer of 
Dallas was her sister’s maid 
of honor and Miss Eileen 
Hesse, Fort Worth, and Miss 
Eloise Novacek, Dwight, Neb., 
niece of the bridegroom, were 
bridesmaids. They wore floor- 
length dresses of pink crepe 
and carried single long-stem­
med roses.

Debbie Zimmerer and Kent 
Wolf, niece and nephew of the 
bride, were flower girl and 
ring bearer.

Rodney Kudlacek of Grafton, 
Neb., nephew of the bride­
groom, was best man. Grooms­
men were Joe Klimet of 
Omaha, Neb., and Alfred No­
vacek of Dwight, brother of 
the bridegroom. Ushers were 
Albert Zimmerer, John No­
vacek of Dwight, and Ernest 
Wolf.

Wedding music was furnish­
ed by Ralph Cox, Fort Worth, 
organist, and Dr. Martin Kra- 
licke and Mrs. David Walter- 
scheid of Muenster, vocalists.

Wedding reception and buf­
fet were held in the Parish 
Hall where Miss Ann Solomon 
of Fort Worth and Miss Alta 
Louise Kuhn registered guests.

■When the newlyweds left 
on their honeymoon, she was 
wearing a yellow Italian silk 
suit with matching acces­
sories. They will make their 
home in Fort Worth. He is 
an auditor for the U.S. De­
partment of Agriculture. She 
works for an oil company.

He is a graduate of Assump­
tion High School in Dwight 
and the University of Nebras­
ka in Lincoln. She is a grad­
uate of Sacred Heart High 
School, Muenster.

Among out of town wedding 
guests were the bridegroom’s 
mother and brother Alfred, 
and Mr. and Mrs. John No­
vacek of Dwight,and relatives 
and friends from points in 
Nebraska, Dallas, Fort Worth, 
Sherman and Cooke County.

STATE
in Gainesville

N O W  thru SAT.
DEAN MARTIN 

GEORGE PEPPARD 
JEAN SIMMONS

"Rough Night in 
Jericho"

Sun. - Mon. - Tues.
P e te r  S e lle rs  

isTh e Jlo b o "
EKLANO BRAZZICEU

. «**»> n«3s» namaur m  *umi ; *s £

Hi-Ho Drive In

THREE-  SHOW S
Sal. Nite only 

"THE T-BIRD G ANG " 
"DATE BAIT" 

"TEENAGE DOLL"

Sun. - Mon. - Tueg. 
"FASTEST GUITAR ALIVE" 

and "UNTAMED"

Starts Wed.
HORROR OF DRACULA" 

"CURSE OF 
FRANKENSTEIN"

Jimmy Eberharts 
Recently W ed Make 
Home in Muenster

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Eber- 
hart, back from their wedding 
trip, are at home here in the 
former Eddie Krahl home.

The couple was married at 
Lindsay August 19 in St. 
Peter’s Church, Father John 
officiating at the Nuptial Mass 
and double ring ceremony. The 
bride is the former Miss Diane 
Zimmerer, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Zimmerer. The bride­
groom is the son of Mrs. Bill 
Eberhart and the late Mr. 
Eberhart, all of Lindsay.

For her wedding the bride 
wore an Empire gown of white 
peau de soie with a lace bod­
ice and train. Her flowers were 
a cascade of white carnations 
and stephanotis centered with 
purple-throated white orchid.

Attending the bride were 
Miss Barbara Devers of Dallas, 
maid of honor, Misses Mary 
Kathryn Flusche and Karon 
Loerwald, bridesmaids. Cyn­
thia Eberhart, groom’s sister, 
was flower girl. They wore 
floor-length blue crepe Empire 
dresses.

Danny Eberhart was his 
brother’s best man. Jimmy 
Flusche and Kenneth Zimmer­
er were groomsmen. Ronald 
Fuhrmann and Michael Fuhr- 
mann ushered.

Wedding reception was held 
in the Parish Hall. Misses 
Kathy Streng and Sharon

Loerwald registered guests.
The newlyweds are Lindsay 

High graduates. He is em­
ployed at Denis’ Texaco here 
and she works for Linda-Jo 
Shoe Co. at Gainesville.

Carrie Mueller, 79 
Dies in Ft. Worth

Miss Carrie Mueller, 79, long 
time Lindsay resident, died 
Tuesday in Fort Worth after 
an extended illness.

Funeral services were held 
Thursday morning in St. 
Mary’s Church at Fort Worth.

Miss Mueller served as 
housekeeper at St. Peter’s Rec­
tory for many years and went 
from there as a housekeeper 
at St. Mary’s Parish. She was 
retired in recent years.

George Washington had red 
hair, usually covered by a 
white wig.

Gasoline Oil. 
Supplies. 
For Your 

Farm Needs

Jimmy Lehnertz
Gulf Distributor

H 054562, Gainesville

Or see local dealer 
Bob's Gulf Station

Mr. and Mrs. John P. Streng 
saw their son John Henry off 
for Navy training Friday night 
by jet from Dallas Love Field. 
They visited Mr. Streng’s sis­
ter and family, the Earl Mc­
Daniels at Richardson, while 
John Henry was being checked 
out, and the McDaniels family 
also went to the air port to 
wave him off.

Confetti - - -
other unions did likewise. The 
values of wages and fixed in­
come and savings would all 
be stabilized. In fact they 
could actually increase as bet­
ter business and increased ef­
ficiency permitted prices to de­
crease gradually.

The column admits that this

HESPERIAN
the oldest savings and loan 

association in Texas.

pays over $475,000 a year 
to residents of Cooke County.

Accounts insured up to $15,000 
by an agency of the Federal Government.

Assets over $13,000,000

H ESPERIAN
BUILDING & SAVINGS ASSOCIATION  

Serving Cooke County Since 1890.
111 E. California, H05-3486, Gainesville

is quite a brainstorm, a radi­
cal departure from methods of 
the past. But, seriously, isn’t 
it worth some thought? The 
way of the past few decades 
has us headed for an inflation­
ary crash. It is fundamentally

wrong because it penalizes 
the virtue of thrift. Something 
needs to be done to stop that 
trend and stabilize our econ­
omy — perhaps even increase 
the real value of earnings and 
savings.

Labor Day
DANCE
Sponsored by Muenster Knights of Columbus

P A R I S H  H A L L
Muenster

Monday, Sept. 4Music by The Circe
$1.25 per person

Shurfine, 7 oz. ElboM A C A R O N I or SP A G H E T T I
Delta quart Kosher

Dill Pickles . . .
Nabisco, 12 oz.

Vanilla Wafers .

__________ 2 -2 5 c
. . 43*

35*
Shuriesh

Oleo, 1 lb. . . 5-$1.00
3c olf label, 17 oz. size

COMET CLEANSER . . 23*

Potato Chips
S 9(Morton's twin pack 

Reg. 69c size ______

Hunt’s Catsup, 14 oz. _ 4 - 89c
Hunt’s, 8 oz.Tomato Sauce _ .  9-$1.00
Stokely's. 46 oz.Fruit Drinks - _ _ 4-$1.00
No. 300 canW olfs Plain Chili _ _ 55c
Glad, 75ct.Sandwich Bags _ _ 3-$1.00
Libby's. 3 Vi oz.Potted Meat _ _ _ 2 - 25c
Hamburger or Hot DogBuns, A .F. _ .  5 pkg $1.00
Reg. 10c, Nestle choc, coveredCarmel Bar .  _ _ .  3 - 19c

Produce
L E T T U C Ehd. 10c
B A N A N A Slb. 10cRadishes 2 bags 19cGreen Onions 2 bunches 19c

Prophylactic 
firm bristle

HAIR BRUSH 
& COMB

$1.00

We'll Close 
All Day On 
Labor Day
F rozen

Tree Top, 12 oz. canApple Juice .  .  _ .  2 -69c

LAUNDRY
DETERGENT
w ith

ultramarine p/i/s
N 'l v *giant 69c

Shurfrost, 11 oz.Turkey Dinner .  _ 2 - 79c
M E L L O R IN E

AJ\ All POPULAR FLAVORS

2  9 $

100 S&HGreen Stamps
With each 100 lbs. 
oi meat processed.

• •  • *

MeatsTop Round Steak . lb. 75cRound Steak _ _ _ lb. 69c
Decker's JumboBologna _ _ _ _ . lb. 49c
A.F., 12 oz. pkg., all meatWieners _ _ .  39c
Affiliated, reg. rule. 500 sheets

FILLER PAPER . .  89c
Energy 10 lb. bag Charcoal

BR IQ U ETS_ _ _ _ .  49c

W E G I V E

DOUBLE 
STAMPS ON 
WEDNESDAY
With grocery purchase 
of $5.00 or more (no 

cigarettes) on Wednesday 
we give twice as many 

S&H Green Stamps


