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Khrushchev must be gloat­
ing over the race riots that 
are terrorizing New York City 
and Rochester and, according 
to a Negro leader in Buffalo, 
threaten also to break out 
there. Turmoil such as that is 
one of the principal aims of 
the communist conspiracy. 
The pattern of procedure has 
been used many times. It’s the 
well known diabolical scheme 
to weaken this country by 
promoting hatred and violence. 
Every such incident hurts the 
nation and the hurts are slow 
to heal. Like the vultures they 
are, reds are feasting on the 
social devastation they are 
causing.

It would be most difficult 
to explain the race troubles 
any other way. These things 
are happening shortly after 
passage of the civil rights law. 
Negroes should be pleased. 
They got the changes they 
were asking for. In fact, judg­
ing from their threats and 
coercive demonstrations, this 
might have been expected if 
the law had not passed. Well, 
they got their way but they 
are storming anyway. What, 
then, is the reason for the 
anarchy? Why the rampage 
when they ought to be satis­
fied?

You and I are reasonably 
certain of the answer. It was 
revealed in several reports 
that known communists were 
recognized as mob leaders, and 
in some cases they were ar­
rested. The ugly hand of Mos­
cow is obvious. Agitators ap­
parently had their misguided 
followers so thoroughly work­
ed up that they could continue 
the dirty work even after 
Washington’s conciliatory law.

This view is further support­
ed by the fact that New York 
Negroes actually had no legal 
grievances in the first place. 
The state’s civil rights were 
and are more favorable to 
colored people than the highly 
controversial federal law. They 
already had a good deal and 
they should have been pleased. 
Their eruption can be explain­
ed only as the work of trouble 
makers.

The really sad fact is that 
the poor unfortunates do not 
even realize they are being 
exploited by enemies who 
have no real regard for their 
welfare. They are working 
for Khrushchev, who has al­
ready shown his contempt for 
their race by the shabby 
treatment of African students 
in Moscow. Communists preach 
about the equality of races but 
they don’t practice it.

Our government, so eager 
to help the Negroes, had better 
start looking for the real cause 
behind Negro troubles. Fur­
thermore, it should weigh the 
possibility that its own leni­
ency toward communism is 
due the blame for mo3t of our 
racial strife of the past dec­
ade. Keen observers, including 
the FBI, have seen the reds 
at work through the entire 
controversy.

What will be the solution? 
Will federal troops have the 
ugly job of putting down the 
uprisings by force? Will un­
thinking Negroes have to pay 
for their rashness while the 
rabble rousers hide out and 
await their next chance to 
cause trouble? Or will our 
leaders have the good judg­
ment to treat the cause rather 
than the symptoms of racial 
unrest?

This column is firmly con­
vinced that there is one cer­
tain remedy. That is to make 
good use of information avail­
able in FBI files and lower 
the boom on every known 
communist involved in the 
turmoil. Don’t waste time look­
ing for active participation in 
the rough stuff. That would 
be futile because the scoun­
drels are clever enough to a- 
void arrest or beat the rap on 
such charges. But nab them 
simply because they are known 
communists and agitators — 
and that includes plenty of 
Negroes who are more red than 
black. After they have been 
thrown in jail, and the key 
thrown away, it may still be 
necessary to round up hot head 
gang leaders who exercise 
more hatred than judgment 
After that the violence will 
fizzle. Most of the thought­
less mobs now responding to 
rabble rousers will settle down 
when their leaders are gone.

Another point that deserves 
some thought: It’̂  high time 
for the Negro leaders who 
were so insistent on their peo­
ple’s rights to start insisting 
on their people’s responsibili­
ties. If they are so determined 
that their race be respected 
why aren’t they equally de­
termined that their race must 

(Continued on page 8)

Cloud Was a Dud, 
Rainfall Only .04

A fine looking cloud was a 
big disappointment Wednes­
day night and prospects for a 
good rain resulted in a meas­
ure of only .04 inch.

Practically speaking th e  
month might as well be bone 
dry. The only additional mois­
ture was .02 on July 2, a grand 
total of .06 up to the second 
last day.

Rainfall for June was not 
much better, a total of .64 
inch on the 13th and 17th. So 
the measure for the two 
months is .70 That’s dry, and 
it seems even worse when 
temperatures are over 100 al­
most every day.

Total rainfall for the year 
is 16.32 inches.

NEWS
OF THE SICK

Andy O’Connor was released 
from Nocona Hospital Monday 
afternoon after being a pa­
tient since July 3 following a 
stroke. He is convalescing at 
his home.

A sister and brother are re­
covering from tonsillectomies. 
Shirley and Paul Joseph Beck­
er, children of Mr. and Mrs. 
Martin Becker, had the oper­
ations at Wilson N. Jones Hos­
pital in Sherman Tuesday. 
They entered the hospital 
Monday evening and were dis­
missed Wednesday. They are 
going to be shut-ins about a 
week and look forward to 
mail.

Four-year-old Roy Metzler, 
son of the Gerald Metzlers, Rt. 
2, Gainesville, broke his left 
leg below the knee last Thurs­
day during play. A cast is on 
and he has to stay in bed at 
home. Cards will help him pass 
the long days in bed.

From San Jose, Calif., came 
word Monday evening that 
Michael Driever had an emer­
gency operation for appendi­
citis. His wife phoned his 
mother Rosa Driever to tell 
about it and to report that he 
stood the surgery well. Another 
telephone call Tuesday even­
ing gave the good word that 
he was recovering satisfactor­
ily and would be hospitalized 
four or five days.

Former Muenster Pastor Fa­
ther Thomas Buergler of A1 
tus, Ark., is reported on the 
mend after a recent operation 
for stomach ulcers. He parted 
with three-fourths of his 
stomach.

Recurrence of an old leg ail­
ment sent James Bayer of 
Valley View to Muenster Hos 
pital for treatment. He entered 
Saturday evening.

BISHOP THOMAS K. GORMAN OFFIC.ATED Sunday at the blessing of the new 
elementary building and the new gymnasium of the Lindsay school. Shown here in the 
class building, he is attended by Father Joseph Wahlen of Corpus Christi and Father 
Sylvester Schad of Corpus Christi. Father Paul Hoedebeck of Subiaco is near Father 
Wahlen. Father John Walbe, Lindsay pastor, is at the far right.

—Boyd and Breeding Photo

Mrs. Frank Kaiser went to 
Houston Tuesday for her rou­
tine checkup . . . expected to 
be back some time Thursday.

Ed Hacker underwent sur­
gery Monday in Gaston Hos­
pital at Dallas. His wife Odessa 
went with him. He was dis­
missed Wednesday.

City Gets Double 
Benefit at State 
Firemen’s School

Fire Chief Alvin Hartman 
returned home during the 
weekend after attending the 
35th annual firemen’s training 
school at Texas A&M Univers­
ity. The course is conducted 
by the Engineering Extension 
Service of A&M in coopera­
tion with Texas Education 
Agency and is sponsored by 
the State Firemen’s and Fire 
Marshals’ Association.

The course consists of class 
work and actual problems in 
which fires are set to be ex­
tinguished by the students. In­
structors are mostly career 
firemen, those with years of 
experience on the fire depart­
ments of big cities and military 
establishments. They teach the 
fundamentals of safety and fire 
fighting and also introduce 
new techniques and new de­
velopments in equipment.

The firemen’s training school 
serves a double purpose. In­
structions received there can 
be applied back home in mak­
ing a fire department more 
efficient. And the course earns 
a handsome reduction in a 
city’s insurance premium. A 
credit of 3 per cent on the 
city’s key rate is allowed in a 

•ity that sends one person to 
the firemen’s school. A credit 
of 5 Der cent is allowed if the 
city has two men at the fire­
man’s school and one at the 
fire marshals’ school.

At Muenster the city pays 
the fireman’s expense at the 
school and everyone who pays 
a fire insurance premium 
shares in the b e n e f i t .  
Mayor Earl Fisher estimates 
that the combined savings on 
all fire insurance premiums 
here are much higher than the 
cost of attending the firemen’s 
school.

B I R T H S

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hoede­
beck proudly announce arrival 
of a son, a baby brother for 
their two other sons and five 
daughters. The newcomer was 
born at Muenster Hospital 
Monday, July 27, 10:31 a.m. 
weighing five pounds 15 ounces 
He has two grandmothers, 
Mrs. Fred Hoedebeck, Muen­
ster, and Mrs. Joe Sanchez of 
Derby, Kansas.

Mr. and Mrs. David Gilley 
of Gainesville are parents of 
a daughter, making Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Otto of Muenster 
grandparents again. The little 
girl arrived at Gainesville 
Hospital Thursday, July 23, 
3:42 a.m. weighing six pounds 
10 ounces. She’s a sister for 
David Jr. and has been named 
Daveta Stacey.

Mrs. Emmett Samek, Rt. 4 
Gainesville, underwent ma­
jor surgery at Baylor Hospital 
in Dallas and will be a patient 
about two weeks. Her daugh­
ter, Miss Margie Samek, went 
with her. Greeting cards for 
Mrs. Samek will reach her ad­
dressed to her in care of the 
hospital.

Mrs. Maurice Pagel con­
tinues convalescence following 
surgery. She’s Staying in Fort 
Worth with her sister, Mrs. 
Bobby Howell and family, 3309 
Hughes St., Fort Worth 2.

HOSPITAL NOTES
The following is the list of 

patients admitted and dis 
missed at Muenster Memorial 
Hospital during the past week.

Friday: Admitted — Mrs. 
Don Flusche.

Staurday: Admitted — Char­
lie Langston, Robert Zimmer- 
er, Lindsay, Mr3. Lois Embry, 
Saint Jo; James Bayer, Gaines­
ville.

Monday: Admitted — Mrs 
Gme Hoedebeck; Hoedebeck 
baby boy born; Mrs. Grace 
Phillips, Saint Jo; Mrs. Fred 
Knabe. Dismissed — Mrs. 
Don Flusche.

Tuesday: Admitted — Knabe 
baby boy born. Dismissed — 
Robert Zimmerer, Lindsay.

As of Wednesday afternoon 
there were fourteen patients in 
the hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Herr, 
707 Walter Road, Gainesville, 
ajinounce the birth of a son 
at 1:22 a.m. Friday, July 24, 
at Gainesville Hospital. They 
have one other boy and four 
girls. The baby’s grandparents 
are Messrs, and Mmes. Frank 
Herr and Albert Henscheid of 
Muenster.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Knabe 
have announced the birth of 
their second son, a brother for 
Terry. The newcomer arrived 
Tuesday, July 28, 12:35 a.m. 
at Muenster Hospital weigh­
ing six and a half pounds. His 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Derichsweiler and Joe 
Knabe.

Mr. and Mrs. T. J . Gorman 
of Rockford, 111., announce a 
son bom Tuesday, July 28. 
They’ve named him Richard 
Andrew. He. has three bro­
thers and three sisters and is 
a grandson for Mr. and Mrs. 
Werner Endres.

Charlotte on TV 
Does Talent Act

Charlotte Wolf, Miss Muen­
ster in the Miss Texas Pageant 
at Fort Worth last week, was 
featured in her talent dance 
number Saturday night on 
television on the Texas News. 
Barbara Jones, Miss Gaines­
ville, also appeared in her tal­
ent number. The girls made 
fine showings for Cooke Coun­
ty.

Mr. and Mrs. Lou Wolf at­
tended the pageant from the 
beginning Wednesday through 
the finale Saturday. Also see­
ing pageant features and the 
finals Saturday were local 
Jaycee President Joe Gallo­
way and Mrs. Galloway. Miss 
Muenster wa3 sponsored by 
the Junior Chamber of Com­
merce.

News of the 
Men in Service

Catholic League 
State Convention 
Closes at Lindsay

The sixty sixth annual con­
vention of the Catholic State 
League came to a close at 
Lindsay Monday morning with 
Benediction following a clos­
ing meeting that heard reports 
of committees, adopted reso­
lutions, and named Rowena as 
its 1965 convention city.

The closing formalities fol­
lowed a full program on Sun­
day, which had been sched­
uled as the big day of the 
convention. A solemn pon­
tifical high mass with Bishop 
Thomas K. Gorman of the Dal- 
las-Fort Worth Diocese as 
celebrant was the outstanding 
religious event. Present, in 
addition to his attendants, 
was a large group of clergy 
attending the convention, in­
cluding Abbot Michael Lens- 
ing of Subiaco Abbey and Ab­
bot Alfred Hoenig of Corpus 
Christi Abbey. Fourth Degree 
Knights of Columbus attended 
as an honor guard.

Father Alcuin Kubis of 
Muenster gave the sermon, 
urging people to cooperate in 
the activities of the Catholic 
State League and live up to 
its principles. He told them to 
help young people by advice 
and example, and to stand up 
and be counted on God’s side 
whenever principle is involved.

After mass Bishop Gorman 
departed f r o m  convention 
business and officiated at the 
blessing of two new parish 
buildings, the grade school 
and the gymnasium, which 
will be ready for the begin­
ning of the next school year.

The Catholic Day program 
at 8 o’clock Sunday night 
featured two talks. Mrs. Mike 
Smith of D’Hanis spoke about 
“The Laity and the Church 
Today.” Charles O Galvin of 
the SMU law school discussed 
“Communism and the Papal 
Encyclicals.”

The convention marked the 
(Continued on page 8)

Officers Await 
Information on 
Frightened Negro

A frightened colored man, 
arrested here about 1:30 p.m. 
Tuesday by Bill Pratt, is in 
Cooke County jail, apparently 
a mental patient and detained 
until more can be learned a- 
bout him. Pratt said he has 
sent inquiries to former ad­
dresses of the man in Cali­
fornia and New Mexico. Up 
to Wednesday noon he had 
no reply.

The man came to town 
Monday morning and brought 
his car to Tuggle Motor Co. 
for an adjustment. When the 
work was finished he paid his 
bill but did not leave. Shortly 
before noon he told Aubry 
Tuggle that he was afraid the 
heat was too much for two 
puppies in the car. He got a 
bag of ice and some dog food 
for them. He also stated that 
some people were out to get 
him.

During the noon hour he 
wandered alway, leaving his 
car and the puppies. He was 
seen by several persons in 
town and west of town, and 
was reported at the A1 Schmitt 
farm about 1:30 Tuesday af­
ternoon. Pratt found him there.

His story was that he had 
spent Monday night in the 
timber west of town and five 
men were trying to kill him. 
Two negroes, two Mexicans 
and one white man.

Pratt took a 32 revolver 
from him and has not decided 
yet whether to charge him 
with carrying a concealed 
weapon or take him to an in­
stitution.

Meanwhile the car is still 
here and the puppies have a 
temporary home.

A California driver’s license 
in the car shows that he is 35 
years old, got his license in 
March. Title papers show the 
car was bought in New Mexico 
in June.

Gets Master's Degree
Lawrence Milner, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. M. F. Milner is one of 
about 700 students who re­
ceived diplomas last Friday 
night at Western Michigan 
University, Kalamozoo, Mich. 
He received a master’s degree 
in business administration.

32 at Day Camp
Thirty-two Muenster Camp 

Fire girls have been attending 
day camp at Camp Myers, 
Gainesville, the past week and

Ends Army Tour
Muenster is home again for 

Werner Becker Jr. after three 
years in uniform and two and 
a half years overseas on army 
duty in Germany. The stay in 
Germany permitted travel to 
other countries during leave 
time and included a visit in 
Rome. After being separated 
from the service in New Jersey 
h° visited the World’s Fair en- 
route home.
See Son At Camp

The H®nry Grewing family 
H H  w°nt to El Paso to spend Sun- 

this week. They travel back.^gy wjth their son and bro- 
anc! forth in a school bus ac- ] Lennie Grewing, who is 
compamed by two mothers shortly for overseas
each day. Camp ends Friday 
with a ceremonial at Leonard 
Park. Parents and friends are
invited.

Mrs. Clarence Albers and 
sons Robert and Doyle spent 
a few days of the past week 
with her father, Fred Herr 
and family.

duty without getting time to
visit at home.

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Pelzel and 
children of Ennis spent a 
few days with her par­
ents, the Joe Hoenigs and other 
Muenster relatives and with 
relatives in Lindsay while 
they were on vacation.

Cards 5/ Crows 4; 
Hawks and lays 
Game Rained Out

Fans were pleased, but not 
the players, when the second 
Pee Wee game Wednesday 
night was rained out. But the 
fans, too, were disappointed 
later as the shower fizzled out. 
The net result was no game 
and practically no rain.

However all got their 
money’s worth in the first 
ussle when the second place 

Crows nearly spoiled the per­
fect record of the champ Card­
inals. They tied the count at 
4 all with a nice rally in the 
third and the Cards finally 
out over their winning run 
in the last inning.

An advantage of 4 walks to 
1 paid off for the Cards. Other­
wise the teams were even with 
4 hits and 3 walks each.

Hitters for the Cards were 
Jim Schmitz a homer, Jim 
Endres a triple, Glenn Felder- 
hoff and Allen Hess a single 
each. For the Crows there were 
singles by Billy Pratt, Ricky 
Walterscheid, Ronny Hess, 
and Dale Heilman.

Pitchers were Jim Endres 
and Fred Fuhrmann for the 
Cards, Ricky Walterscheid 
and John Schneider for the 
Crows.

Scouts Return 
From 2 Weeks at 
National Jamboree

The six Boy Scouts who at­
tended the National Jamboree 
at Valley Forge, Pa., are back 
home, with pleasant memories 
of two thrilling weeks. They 
had a week of camp life and 
almost a week of sight-seeing 
in New York, Philadelphia 
and Washington.

At Valley Forge their pro­
gram consisted mainly of daily 
chores and working on their 
Jamboree adventure award. 
The boys did their own cook­
ing, drawing rations daily 
from their troop, and also did 
their housekeeping, standing 
regular inspections.

The adventure award was a 
combination of achievement 
tests, principally rifle and 
shotgun shooting, archery, ang­
ling, tying knots, carving 
neckerchief slides and draw­
ing a map of the troop camp­
site. All of the Muenster boys 
passed their tests and re­
ceived their Jamboree Adven­
ture Awards.

Jerry Fleitman also got a 
bonus award far the troop’s 
best record with the shotgun 
— 7 out of 10 clay pigeons. 
He received a uniform patch 
and a certificate and a medal 
is to follow. He also placed 
fourth in target shooting. 
Shotguns used, like the rifles, 
were 22 caliber. Shotgun shells 
looked like regulation 22 cart­
ridges, except they were load­
ed with rat shot.

Nights were spent in camp­
fire sessions, except the first 
and last. Opening night the 
entire Jamboree crowd of a- 
bout 50,000 saw a gigantic 
show with a cast of 6,000, a 
band of 150 and a chorus of 
1600. The closing event was 
candle light ceremony — 50,- 
000 candles — with President 
Johnson present.

Last Friday after packing 
and shipping their gear the 
Muenster boys went to Wash­
ington for a day and a half. 
Principal stops there were the
Capitol, the White House
Smithsonian museum, th e  
mint, Mount Vernon, Arling 
ton Cemetery, President Ken­
nedy’s grave and Lincoln
monument. At 5:30 they 
boarded a jet plane for Dallas.

Before the Jamboree opened 
they spent three days seeing 
sights at the World’s Fair, New 
York City and Philadelphia.

Muenster Scouts attending 
the Jamboree were James 
Dangelmayr, Jerry Fleitman, 
Don Hartman, Joe Hartman, 
Bobby Knauf and Kenneth
Swirczynski. Along with 31 
other boys from Gainesville, 
McKinney and Farmersville 
they made up Troop 45 of the 
national encampment.

Joe Fuhrmann, 80, 
Lindsay Resident 
Since 1897, Dies

Joe J. Fuhrmann, 80, a pio­
neer resident of Lindsay, died 
at 2 a.m. Saturday in his home 
after a lengthy illness. He was 
a retired farmer.

Funeral services were held 
Monday in St. Peter’s Church 
of which he was a member 
since coming to Lindsay in 1897.

Celebrant of the solemn re­
quiem mass was his son, Fa­
ther Bruno Fuhrmann of Muen­
ster. Assistants were the de­
ceased’s brother, Father Joseph 
Fuhrmann of Clarksville, Ark., 
and two nephews, Fathers 
Nicholas Fuhrmann and David 
Flusche, of Subiaco. Ab­
bot Alfred Hoenig of Corpus 
Christi delivered the sermon 
and Abbot Michael Leasing of 
Subiaco conducted graveside 
rites.

George J. Carroll & Son 
Funeral Home directed burial 
in Lindsay Cemetery. Rosary 
services were held in the Car- 
roll Chapel at 8 p.m. Saturday 
and at 3 and 8 p.m. Sunday. 
Nephews were bearers.

Joe Fuhrmann was bom in 
Iowa June 6, 1884, a son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Fuhr­
mann, and moved to Lindsay 
with them when he was 13 
years old. On April 27, 1915 
he married Miss Mary Orth 
at Lindsay.

Survivors are his wife; two 
sons, Father Bruno of Muen­
ster and Brother Michael 
fuhrmann of Subiaco; four 
daughters, Mrs. Paul Klein of 
Topeka, Kansas, Mrs. Henry 
Stoffels of Lindsay, Mrs. 
Frank Gulley of Vienna, S. D., 
and Mrs. Steve Grewing of 
Muenster; six brothers, Fa­
ther Joseph Fuhrmann of 
Clarksville, Mike, Tony, Matt, 
Willie and Henry S. Fuhrmann, 
all of Lindsay; four sisters, 
Mrs. A. C. Flusche of Denison, 
Mrs. Anna Loerwald of Lind­
say, Mrs. Max Koesler of 
Vinita, Okla., and Mrs. Al- 
fons Koesler of Muenster; 
and 25 grandchildren.

Among those attending the 
funeral were Mrs. Frank Gully 
and son, Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Klein and family, Mrs. Ger­
ald Wachsman and daughter 
of Wichita Falls, Mr. and Mrs. 
A. C. Flusche of Denison, Mrs. 
John Fuhrmann of New Bruan- 
fels. Sisters Henry Ann and 
Michael Marie Fuhrmann of 
San Antonio.

Members of the clergy pres­
ent, in addition to those al­
ready mentioned, included the 
Rev. Fathers Vincent Orth, 
Subiaco; Ignatius Bodmeyer 
and Cletus Post of Windthorst, 
Sylvester Schad of Corpus 
Christi, Leo Koesler, Paul 
Hoedebeck, Stephen Eckart, 
Brenden McGuire and Fintan 
Oldham, all of Subiaco; Da­
mian Wewers of Fort Worth, 
John Gillespie of Pilot Point, 
Alcuin Kubis and Martin 
Fischer of Muenster, John 
Walbe of Lindsay, Joseph 
Weinzapfel of Dallas, Msgr. 
Drodz of New Braunfels and 
Father Henkes of Kennedy.

Also present were Brothers 
Henry Fuhrmann, Michael 
Fuhrmann and Louis Fuhr­
mann of Subiaco.

Foot Injury Sends 
Bobby Zimmerer to 
Muenster Hospital

Bobby Zimmerer was dis­
missed from Muenster Hos­
pital Tuesday after being a 
patient since Saturday after­
noon whe he had an accident 
that injured his left foot . . . 
broke one toe and cut a gash 
that needed 30 stitches.

The accident happened while 
Bobby was making repairs to 
a mowing machine suspended- 
above the floor at Parker 
Fears’ Garage in Myra. The 
chain hoist holding the mower 
pulled loose enough so that the 
machine fell catching Bobby’s 
foot beneath the mower blade.

Mrs. Jack Schultz and son 
Sammy of Gainesville who 
were visiting nearby, took 
young Zimmerer to Muen­
ster Hospital for treatment. A 
surgeon from Saint Jo waited 
on him. He is the 14-year-old 
son of the Bruno Zimmerers.

Schedule of 
Coming Events

FRIDAY, July 31, Angels- 
Twins, Colts-Mets.

MONDAY, Aug. 3, VFW 
Auxiliary meeting.

WEDNESDAY, Aug. 5, K of 
C meeting.

WEDNESDAY, Aug.  5, 
Hawks-Crows, Jays-Cards.

It
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ANOTHER FAMILY FIGHT?
If the Washington “insiders” 

are correct, the Republican 
family ruckus in San Fran­
cisco recently is going to fade 
into a distant second place to 
a really big Democratic Party 
fight in Atlantic City shortly.

The columnists and big-city 
correspondents in Washing­
ton are nervous about report­
ing the story, but they’re all 
talking behind their hand a- 
bout the prospects for a first- 
class squabble over the ticket 
to oppose Goldwater and Mil­
ler in November.

What they’re talking about 
is a prospective bid by Attor­
ney-General Robert Kennedy 
to replace Lyndon Johnson at
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or 15 pound bags 
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the head of the Democratic 
Party ticket. If that possibility 
strikes you as impossible, re­
flect before you wager. It was 
Robert Kennedy who person­
ally corralled the delegates 
for his brother’s successful 
campaign in 1960. As mana­
ger of that campaign he de­
veloped the political contacts 
and organized friendly state 
and local delegations.

He has, say the insiders, 
carefully maintained those 
contacts, and the estimate is 
that Robert Kennedy can re­
cruit perhaps as much as forty 
percent of the delegates to the 
Atlantic City Convention to 
support his nomination. Clear­
ly forty percent wouldn’t be 
enough, but then there’s Gov­
ernor Wallace who may show 
up in New Jersey with fifteen 
or twenty percent of the total 
delegates in his briefcase. The 
whispering may be premature, 
but the mathematics is right 
for a fight.

If Mao and Khrushchev can

In All 
The World
No one is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you.

GEO. J .

Carroll
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PIANOS & ORGANS 
BAND INSTRUMENTS 

GIBSON & KAY GUITARS 
SHEET MUSIC 

SLINGERLAND DRUMS
EXPERT PIANO 

TUNING & REPAIR

TURBERVILLE MUSIC CO.
212 E. Calif., H05-3831, Gainesville
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Here’s one big reason. It’s guaranteed wash­
able. Fingermarks, even crayon marks, wash 
off easily. Stays beautiful for years. One coat 
covers and one gallon does the walls of an 
average room.

W e  h a v e  all the N E W  co lors  
C o m e  In and  se e  th e m l

COMMUNITY LUMBER CO.
Jerome Pagel and Rody Klement

“From each according to his ability. . .  
to each according to his need/'— K arl M ap.x .

have a family fight, Goldwater 
and Scranton can have a fam­
ily fight, why not Bobby and 
Lyndon?

Now there would be a real 
rumpus.

DEAD END ROAD
Charles Edison’s years of 

public service included such 
high positions as Governor of 
New Jersey and Secretary of 
the Navy.

Recently he was asked this 
question: “What has happened 
to America?” His answer: 
“The empty philosophy of So­
cialism is replacing the rich 
and free traditions of Amer­
ica. . . . The strength of the 
American people has been 
sapped . . . we have become a 
country where self-reliance, 
pride, hard work and thrift 
are being replaced by ideas of 
dependency on government, 
pleasure before duty, higher 
pay for less work and the 
right to government handouts.”

Those are hard and pessi­
mistic words. But they are 
justified. The loss of individual 
liberty has been a step by step 
affair — a gradual erosion. 
So, it has happened almost 
unnoticed by multitudes. But 
its sour fruits are found in 
the way these multitudes al­
most automatically turn to a 
super state in the search for 
solutions to almost every hu­
man problem. Lost, forgotten 
and tramped under are the 
responsibilities that used to 
belong to the family, to local 
initiative and generosity, to 
the kind of self-reliance that 
created the nation.

That is the record. The 
overriding, unanswered ques­
tion is: “Will we take another 
course before it is too late?” 
The road we are traveling is 
easy — but it has a dead end.

JOHNSON AND MARX
When Light Bulb Lyndon 

addressed the Texas Press As­
sociation convention in Hous­
ton on June 21 he said: We 
are going to TAKE all the 
money that WE think is un­
necessarily spent and TAKE 
it from the HAVES and give 
it to the HAVE-NOTS who 
need it so much.” Who does 
Lyndon think he is? Robin 
Hood?

Now we remember another 
great politician — a fellow 
named Karl Marx — who laid 
down the fundamental law of 
the Communist party saying 
the same thing in much more 
elegant language. He said, 
“From each according to his 
ability, to each according to 
his need.”

We can find no conflict of 
philosophy between K a r l  
Marx’s statement in the Com­
munistic Manifesto in 1848, and 
Mr. Johnson’s declaration of 
June 21, 1964, except, of course, 
in semantics.

— Kingsville, Texas, Record

Connally Protests 
Insult to Texas

Reference in “NATO Let­
ter” to Texas as a “semi-civil- 
ized part of America” peopled 
with oil millionaires who ser­
ve as financial angels for radi­
cal right “hatemongers” bro­
ught strong protest from Gov­
ernor Connally to Secretary of 
State Rusk.

“The fact that (the author) 
was emotionally distressed by 
the tragedy (President Ken­
nedy’s assassination), as so 
many of us were who were 
much more directly involved, 
is no excuse to print such an 
irresponsible diatribe in a mag­
azine of this nature,” Connally 
wrote.

Since the U. S. State Depart­
ment is directly connected with 
the publication, the governor 
said, future articles should at­
tempt "to undo the harm” al­
ready done.

WHAT "PRUDENCE 
& ECONOMY"?

Senator Harry F. Byrd, 
Virginia’s outstanding patriot, 
and untiring exponent of sane 
fiscal policy, blasted the John­
son extravagance from the 
Senate floor as he announced 
he would vote against the 
latest lift in the debt ceiling 
— as he had voted against it 
in the Finance Committee of 
which he is chairman.

In discussing the bill to in­
crease the debt limit to $324 
billion until the end of next 
June when, says the Secretary 
of the Treasury, it will to be 
boosted again, the Senator de­
clared: “This is the largest in­
crease in the Federal debt 
limit in 19 years. Under it, 
the debt will rise to its highest 
point of all time.”

To convert the upcoming 
deficit into a surplus the Sen­
ator proposes cutting 1965 Fed­
eral spending by $6.5 billion 
and selling off non-essentials 
in the Government’s $8.5 bil­
lion strategic and critical ma­
terials stockpile.

T h e  Virginia Democrat 
quoted a Presidential memor­
andum of last November 30 to 
all Federal Department heads 
in which Mr. Johnson said: 
“I have pledged that the Ex­
ecutive Branch will be ad­
ministered with the utmost 
thrift and frugality; that the 
Government will get a dollar’s 
value for a dollar spent; and 
that the Government will set 
an example of prudence and 
economy.” And the Senator 
declared:

“I regard passing this bill 
(which happened in the Sen­
ate shortly after his speech), 
raising the debt limit, increas­
ing the debt, and continuing 
operation of the Federal Gov­
ernment on a planned deficit 
basis as a breach of policy en­

acted by Congress and declared 
by the President.

“Such needless use of deficit- 
and-debt financing is reckless 
and dangerous. It has become 
chronic. The end is not in 
sight. We have got to stop at 
some point. I am voting a- 
gainst this bill in the belief 
that now is better than later.”

These are undoubtedly the 
sentiments of the great rank 
and file of American taxpay­
ers. And though, once more, 
Senator Byrd’s protest was in 
vain, we can be sure his words 
reached the White House. And 
perhaps the man who prides 
himself on turning out un­
needed lights in that mansion 
will yet heed the Byrd pro­
posals for economy.

IS YOUR SNAIL SICK?
What is your tax mone(y 

used for?
Thrre’s an easy answer — to 

pay for the national defense, to 
maintain the executive, legis­
lative and judicial departments 
of the government, and so on.

But it’s the safest of bets 
that the average citizen, would 
be amazed if he knew where 
some of his money goes.

Examples: The federal gov­
ernment spent $18,000 on a 
study to learn why patients 
break appointments at pedia­
tric clinics. It spent $1,250,000 
to study the relationship be­
tween an infant monkey and 
its mother. It spent $11,500 to 
study blood group genetics of 
Southampton Island Eskimos. 
It spent $20,092 to study dis­
eases of the giant snail.

Such a list could be con­
tinued almost endlessly. The 
individual amounts are small. 
But there is more to it than 
just the money involved. 
These are examples of what 
happens when a central gov­
ernment, peopled by avaricious 
bureaucrats all seeking more 
power and larger appropria­
tions, try to do all things for 
all men and all interests.

Large oaks from little a- 
crons grow. Small cuts, in 
totally nonessential govern­
ment projects, can add up to 
large budget reductions, to the 
benefit of us all.

CONFUSING THE 
CONFUSION

There is little doubt that the 
attitude of the American peo­
ple toward foreign aid as now 
constituted has been chang­
ing and hardening. This does not 
mean that the nation is going 
isolationist; it does mean that 
there is more and more rea­
soned doubt that the mere 
spending of limitless billions 
will really add to the strength 
and influence of this nation 
abroad, and there is an equally 
reasoned feeling that the many 
countries on the receiving end 
of aid are sitting on their 
hands and doing very little 
to help solve their own pro­
blems.

This attitude certainly ap­
plies to aid for military as­
sistance as well as for eco­
nomic development and re­
lated purposes.

Moreover, the overall aid

100 per cent wool, fur trimmed, lining un­
conditionally guaranteed for life of garment, 
growing hem and sleeves, sizes 3-14. $24.98

Nice selection of other styles and colors 
in Curtsy Coats.

Buy Now and Lay Away 
10 per cent discount during August.

Tyke Town
113 E. California, Gainesville

program seems to have gotten 
almost completely out of hand. 
According to Representative 
Passman who is chairman of 
the Foreign Operations Sub­
committee on Appropriations. 
26 federal agencies are now 
dispensing some type of for­
eign aid, and the total for this 
fiscal year may exceed $7 bil­
lion, not including interest on 
borrowed money. He adds: 
“It is fantastic but true that 
our government will be dis­
pensing funds during Fiscal 
1965 in 99 nations and 9 ter­
ritories. Furthermore, this un­
controlled and apparently un­
controllable program now has 
71,416 people, including par­
ticipants, on its payroll. It has 
reached such proportions that 
even the confusion is confus­
ed.”

Foreign aid — in scope, 
kind and dollars — is destined 
to be a major politico-eco­
nomic issue in this country 
— an issue which soars be­
yond mere partisan considera* 
tions.

Disarmament is like a Hol­
lywood party. No one wants 
to get there until the others 
have arrived.

Excellent Food 
Properly Served j
The CURTWOOD 
CURTWOOD Jr. 
The COLONIAL

Curtis Restaurants

ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTING

Fixtures
Supplies

Appliances
Residemial, Commercial 

and Oil Field Wiring 
Installations, Repair? 

Appliance Repairs

Call H05-2721
Nights call

H05-3263 or HO5-2204

Parker Electric
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville

f L l  1 COMPLETE 

• S i  FUNERAL 

|  SS SERVICE

U w
Miller

Funeral Home

NOW
AIR CONDITION 

YOUR ENTIRE HOME 
AT A SURPRISING

Add a q u a lity  General 
Electric System to your 
present Warm Air Furnace 
and Enjoy YEAR-ROUND 
COMFORT!

General Electric cuts 
the cost of year-round air 
conditioning—with the rev- 
o lu tio n ary  new. QUIK-  
ATTACH system that cuts 
installation time, sharply 
reduces installation cost!
• O p e r a t e s  wi t h  any  

soundly designed duct 
system and warm air 
furnace.

• Call us now for free sur­
vey-there’s noobligation.

AS LOW  AS

* 2 0 ° . °
month

as long as 
5 years to pay

H&H Sales
112 W. Main 
Gainesville

School Shoes
for boys and girls

$1.99 to $4.99

For The Boys
Uniform Pants are Here

Regulars and Slims

- - - and Matching Jackets

Material for 
Uniform Dresses

A blend of 65% dacron and 35% cotton or 
100% dacron shantung.

We also have
r e a d y  m a d e  u n ifo r m s

(with unfinished hems)

ShoP Ben Franklin and Save

•io BEN FRANKLIN 5 io
• -m i y Qy. >, I r N

O N  ALLY K N O W N

Tony Luke. Muenster
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Nineteen 50-Year 
St. Anne Members 
Receive Gold Pins

Nineteen members of Muen- 
ster’s St. Anne Society were 
among the honored ones re­
ceiving gold pins Sunday at

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC

301 E. Broadway 
H05-3521, Gainesville

If no answer call 
H05-2452

Ray’s Drive-In

East Highway 82

Open Every Day 
6 a.m.-9 p.m.

Cabell's 
Dairy Products

Groceries. Drugs

Ice, Picnic Supplies

Fishing Supplies

the Catholic State League’s 
observance of the golden anni­
versary of the Texas branch 
of the National Catholic Wo­
men’s Union.

Three of them were at Lind­
say at the state convention of 
the League to receive their 
pins personally. Mrs. A1 Wal- 
terscheid, society president, 
brought the pins back for the 
others.

The 50-year members are 
Mines. John Fette, G. H. Hell- 
man, J. S. Horn, Mike Kleiss, 
John Schilling, Joseph Paut- 
ler, Barney Voth, Joe Walter­
scheid. John Wilde, Fred Hoe- 
debeck, I. A. Schoech, W. M. 
Truebenbach. Joe Swirczyn- 
ski. John Hartman, Werner 
Endres, John Rohmer, Ben 
Sicking and J. B. Klement.

Mmes. Endres, Rohmer and 
Sicking attended the program.

Fine Photography

Special occasions are more so 
when you celebrate them here.
When you want to honor a  friend or commem­
orate an event, you'll find our delicious food 
and prompt, courteous service fully worthy of 
the occasion. Just check with us to make reser­
vations, select special menus for lunches or 
dinners.

Nothing to celebrate? Our cuisine is, in it­
self, an occasion for celebration. From 
snacks to full course dinners your taste 
always gets a  treat here. Attractive atmos­
phere, too.

The Center
Muenster

Pants . . .
Uniform pants for Sacred Heart. 

Levis in white, green, black, blue.

Shirts . . .
Uniform knit shirts.
Uniform wash & wear shirts.
Sport shirts, long and short sleeve, 

solids, plaids, stripes.

Shoes . . .
P. F. Flyers, Hush Puppies,

Poll Parrot, Scamperoos, Jarman

Socks & Underwear

HAMRIC'S
The place to go for brands you know

Spend Vacation in 
D. C. and Virginia

Mrs. Arthur Tuggle and son 
Frankie report a wonderful 
vacation in Washington, D. C., 
and Virginia, making the trip 
with her parents, the Bill Tug­
gles of Gainesville.

Highlights sight-seeing were 
the Capitol Building, the White 
House interior on a conducted 
tour, the Memorials and the 
Smithsonian Institute in Wash­
ington. They crossed th e  
Memorial Bridge and high­
lighted sight seeing by a visit 
to President Kennedy’s grave, 
the grave of the Unknown 
Soldier, and a tour of Arling­
ton Cemetery.

In Fredericksburg, Va., they 
visited the Civil War sites and 
Washington’s boyhood home. 
While there they were guests 
of Mrs. Tuggle’s sister and 
family the James Harlans. Sgt. 
Harlan is stationed at Quantico 
Marine Base in Virginia, at­
tached to the White House 
helicopter escort squadron.

25 at Reunion of 
Joe Walter Clan

Members of the Joe Walter 
family were together Sunday 
evening for a reunion and cov­
ered dish supper in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Ed Sicking. 
Twenty-five were present.

Making up the party were 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Walter, Mrs. 
Bill Graham and sons Kyle 
and Kirk and Micholas Nagy, 
all of Gainesville, Jim Walter 
of Irving, John Walter of Den­
ton, Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey 
Chapman Jr. and children 
Valerie and Aubrey III of Dal­
las, Mr. and Mrs. Barry Blev­
ins and children Belinda, Tom­
my, Phillip and Joe of Cook- 
ville and Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Sicking and children Dianne, 
Peggy, Gary Joe, Timmy and 
Nancy.

The Chapmans and the Blev­
ins spent the weekend in 
Gainesville. Peggy Sicking 
who had been visiting about 
a week with her grandparents 
in Gainesville is back at home, 
making the trip with them 
Sunday.

Stork Makes Third 
Delivery July 14

July is a busy month for the 
stork, at least so far as the 
John G. Harts of Duncanville 
are concerned, and July 14 is 
the date.

John and his wife, Linda 
Faye, became parents again 
on July 14 this year. It was 
their third child. All were born 
on July 14. Diane was bom 
July 14, 1962; David was bom 
the same date in 1963; the 
newest addition, Patrick, was 
born July 14, 1964.

The youn esters are grand­
children of Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Hart of Dallas. Mrs. Hart is the 
former Verena Stelzer o f 
Mnenster.

The proud papa is a second 
class petty officer in the Navy 
stationed at the Dallas Naval 
Air Station as a jet mechanic.

The couple and their babies 
were pictured in the Duncan­
ville Tribune and there was a 
feature story about them in 
the Dallas Times Herald.

Medders Hosts for 
Party for Guests 
At Colonial Manor

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Med­
ders and family had as week­
end guests the Carole and 
Shirley Morat Dancing Troop, 
friends from Memphis, Tenn., 
— six girls, two boys and their 
instructor. The troop is on a 
tour, came here after perform­
ing in New Orleans, La., ac­
cepting the Medders’ invita­
tion to visit in Muenster.

Saturday night the troop ap­
peared as guest artists on the 
New Orleans Night program 
at River Valley Country Club 
in Gainesville and Sunday 
night they performed again at 
Colonial Manor when Mr. and 
Mrs. Medders entertained with 
a poolside party and buffet 
for them.

The party also was a cour­
tesy for the hosts’ nephew and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Smiddy and daughters Pam 
and Melissa of Cleveland, 
Tenn., introducing them to 
friends while they were in 
Muenster for the first time.

Guests at the party Sunday 
night — about a hundred peo­
ple — were from Muenster, 
Gainesville, Saint Jo  and No- 
cona. After a cocktail hour 
guests served themselves from 
a bountiful buffet, t h e n  
watched the floor show pre­
sented on the patio.

The troop’s numbers at both 
performances consisted of ac­
tion songs, tap, ballet and 
acrobatic dancing and included 
a number by the hosts’ daugh­
ter, Cathy Medders, appearing 
again with her adagio partner 
from Memphis dancing class 
days, Johnny Cecalla. They 
presented the difficult rou­
tine in an easy, graceful man­
ner.

Afterward there was danc­
ing for the guests on the patio 
to music by the Epics, a band 
from Nocona.

Back From Trip
Seeing sights in Colorado and 

New Mexico made vacation 
time interesting and enjoyable 
for Mr. and Mrs. A1 Walter- 
scheid who joined the Frank 
Walterscheids of Hereford on 
the trip. They visited, the 
Royal Gorge and other scenic 
spots and Coor’s Brewery in 
Colorado and made a tourist’s 
tour of Santa Fe, N. M., en­
joyed especially seeing the 
famous stairway in the Chapel 
of Our Lady of Light in Loret- 
to Academy. The spiral stair­
way is Santa Fe’s modem 
wonder, famous throughout the 
world. It makes two complete 
360 degree turns and has no 
center pole.

“Milk” made directly from 
vegetable matter without the 
help of a cow is expected on 
.he market shortly. Dr. H. B. 
Franklin, leader of the scient- 
sts who have been working 

since 1956 on the manufactur­
ing process, claims that almost 
30 per cent of the protein in 
suitable vegetable matter can 
he extracted and made diges­
tible by his process, compared 
with the waste of four-fifths of 
he protein in grass by the 
nefficient cow. Looks like the 
ow is going to be out of a job.

Miss Agnes Noggler 
Becomes Bride of 
John David Meurer

—Boyd and Breeding Photo

Miss Agnes Noggler pledged 
vows with John David Meurer 
in a double ring ceremony at 
7 a m. nuptial mass Thursday, 
July 23, in Sacred Heart 
Church with Father Alcuin 
Kubis officiating.

Parents of the couple are 
Mrs. A. J . Noggler and the 
late Mr. Noggler, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Meurer, all of 
Muenster.

Ted Noggler presented his 
sister for marriage. She wore 
a gown of imported silk or­
ganza with overbodice of 
Venice lace designed with a 
scoop neckline and short 
sleeves. The wide skirt swept 
into a chapel train. A coif 
of organza rose petals held 
her veil of silk illusion and she 
carried a purple-throated white 
orchid and feathered carna­
tions atop her prayer book.

Miss Rita Noggler attended 
her sister as bridesmaid. She 
wore a lilac A-line dress of 
silk brocade with white acces­
sories. Her flowers were pink 
rose buds.

Robert Meurer of San An­
tonio was his brother’s best 
man. David Haverkamp and 
David Walterscheid, bride’s 
cousins, ushered.

Anthony Luke, organist, and 
Mrs. Norbert Walterscheid, 
vocal soloist, presented wed­
ding music including “Ave 
Maria” before mass and “Mo­
ther at Your Feet” after the 
service when the bride placed 
a bouquet of white gladioli 
on the Blessed Virgin’s altar. 
Orchid gladioli adorned the 
main altar.

After the wedding, relatives 
and friends were guests for 
breakfast in the Parish Hall. 
Misses Frances and Florence 
Walterscheid, cousins of the 
bride, registered guests.

When the newlyweds left 
on their wedding trip she was 
wearing a champagne knit 
dress with tan accessories. 
They will be at home on 
North Hy. 373 in the Zipper 
house.

Both are graduates of Muen­
ster High School and both are

INCREDIBLE 
10 YEAR 

GUARANTEE*

WE DEFY YOU 10 BUY A BETTER MATTRESS 
WITH COMPARABLE GUARANTEE FOR LESS 
THAN THIS AMAIING LOW PRICE! WAKE UP 
TO SAVINGS, 0ISC0VER WHAT REAL SLEEP IS DURING THIS SALE.

EXPENSIVE HANDCRAFTED, BENCH-MAM CONSTRUCTION ; w  SUTTON FREE, SMOOTH TOP

0URAHE 8 01 COVER

EXCLUSIVE SEAIY EDGE CARDS" ENDS SAGGING 
EDGES

HUNDREDS Of IEMPERED STEEl (OHS

mu o* num
M ltC H M
m i  s n u K
*3 r»

GUARANTIED ’TIL 
197#

UfEllNE MNiRHANOE MHOS (OVER TAUT 

^  TUU SISAl INSUIATION PREVENTS COR Fttl 

MATCHING BOX SPRING ON HARDWOOD FRAME

*$ ET  GUARANTEED 10 YEARS W STRUCTURALLY DCFTCTM, m i  KPANI FABT T IM . PROfOP- 
DONATE ANNUAL V tt  CNAMC THMIAFTEA.

Hess Furniture Company
Muenstor, Texas

e

employed at Muenster State 
Bank.

Out of town guests at the 
wedding were Mrs. C. W. Rat­
liff and son Sam and Miss 
Martha Sue Meurer of Lub­
bock, Mrs. Jack Quinlan of 
South Bend, Ind., Mr. and Mrs. 
Patrick O’Brien and Murlin 
Joe Evans of Dallas, Messrs, 
and Mmes. Lambert Bezner, 
Jimmy Lehnertz and Alvin 
Noggler and Miss Jean Nog­
gler of Gainesville, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ted Noggler, Mr. and 
Mrs. Weldon Bezner, Mrs. 
Melvin Voth and Mr. and Mrs. 
Phillip Metzler of Lindsay, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Wiesman of Austin.

The rehearsal dinner was 
given by Mr. and Mrs. Herbert 
Meurer in their home Wed­
nesday night. The event hon­
oring the bridal party had 13 
guests including out of town 
relatives here for the wedding.

A hot-water heating system 
was added to the White House 
in 1853.

Bug—
BUTANE 
PROPANE
inti CMlidtiue 

wketeqwt m 
tkiiEmifeat

Muenster 
Butane Company

Phone 759-4411

Due to circumstances beyond our controL 
(every cotton-picking thing is going up) we are 
increasing our price for haircuts.

Effective Aug. 3, 1964

Regular Haircut__$1.25
Flat-Top Haircut. .  $1.50

WOLF'S BARBER SHOP
and

TOMMY'S BARBER SHOP

Tommie Lou’s Fine Shoes

original GINO shoes
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Carl Nause Back 
For 1st Visit in 
Thirty-live Years

Coming and Going 
Makes Week Fun 
For Paul Fetsches

Miss Agnes Eckart 
And Bernard Hesse 
Say Vows at Mass

Returning to Muenster for 
the first time since leaving 35 
years ago, Carl Nause found 
things changed considerably.

The former Muenster boy 
and his wife visited here Tues­
day and Wednesday on their 
first vacation since their hon­
eymoon. It is Mrs. Nause’s 
first visit in Texas. They live 
in Newtonsville, Ohio.

They were houseguests of 
the John Grewings here, and 
of his aunt and uncle, the Joe 
Preschers at Lindsay. They 
also went to Wichita Falls to 
visit his mother who is a 
hospital patient.

On the way coming they 
stopped in Little Rock, Ark., 
with his sister, Sister Loretta. 
Leaving here Wednesday they 
were headed for Houston to 
visit a daughter and their 
three grandchildren. One son 
is in the Navy in California, 
their ten other children are at 
home. Carl enjoyed renewing 
acquaintance w i t h  former 
classmates . . . wished he could 
have seen them all.

Mrs. Larry Walterscheid and 
daughter arrived Wednesday 
for a visit with the little girl’s 
grandparents, the J. C. Trach- 
tas. They’re from Cortez, Colo., 
came here from McKinney 
where they spent the first of 
their vacation with her folks.

Things got back to normal 
routine at the Paul Fetsch 
home Tuesday after a week of 
coming and going and relatives 
dropping in from far and near.

It began last week Wednes­
day when the Fetches and 
children went to Rhineland to 
visit relatives and left daugh­
ter Joan with the Leo Fetsches. 
They and their daughter La- 
Verne brought her back Fri­
day and went to Lindsay to 
attend the State League con­
vention. LaVerne was a house- 
guest at her uncle’s home.

Sunday Paul’s sister and 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. Leon­
ard Albus and four children 
of Pep came for dinner and 
stayed over night, returning 
home Monday. Also dinner 
guests were Norma, Doris and 
Charles Lutkenhaus. In the 
evening Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hoe- 
nig were guests to visit the 
out of town folks.

When the Leo Fetsches re­
turned home Monday, Robert 
and Monica Fetsch went with 
them to visit in Rhineland un­
til Wednesday.

Outing at Turner Falls with 
a cook-out and swimming 
Sunday -was enjoyed by Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Herr and 
daughters Paula and Marlene 
and their guests Shirley Kle- 
ment and Monica Yosten.

Saint Jo
RODEO

The Southwest's Fastest Amateur Rodeo

July 30-31, August 1
Performances at 8 p.m.

Adults $1.00 Children 50c

Downtown parade July 30, 5 p.m.

Y o u  c a n  n o w  
have all the con- 
v e n ie n c e t  o f  
m odern  liv in g  
when you install 
a Jensen Auto­
m a t ic  W a t e r  
System. 17 sizes 
to choose from  
— one for every 
home, ranch or 
farm  need. It's 
the sensible way  
to get e ffic ien t, 
low-cosi w ater 
pumping.

C. D. Shamburger Lumber Co.
Dick Trachta, Mgr., Muenster

Seed Grain 
Wanted

We'll buy grain suitable for 
seed — wheat, oats, barley, rye

Baler Wire 
and Twine
WEED & BRUSH SPRAY

TONY’S SEED STORE
Muenster

—Boyd and Breeding Photo

Sacred Heart Church was the 
scene of nuptial services Sat­
urday afternoon uniting in 
marriage Miss Agnes Eckart 
and Bernard Hesse. The bride’s 
uncle, Father Stephen Eckart 
of Subiaco, Ark., read the 
double ring ceremony at 4 
p.m. and celebrated the mass.

Sacred Heart choir and An­
thony Luke, organist, presented 
the music and Mrs. Norbert 
Walterscheid, aunt of the 
bride, was vocal soloist before 
and after the service.

The bride is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. James Eckart. 
She was presented in marri­
age by her father. For her 
wedding she chose a gown of 
imported silk organza over 
taffeta. The fitted bodice had 
a rounded neckline and elbow 
length sleeves. The bouffant 
skirt had extra fullness swept 
to the sides and back where it 
was secured with two self­
material roses and fanned out 
into a chapel train. A panel 
of Alencon lace accented the 
front of the bodice and ex­
tended the full length of the 
skirt.

A crown of crystals and 
pearls held her waist length 
veil and she carried a yellow- 
throat°d orchid and feathered 
carnations on top of her pray­
er book, a gift from the groom. 
He is a son of the late Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Hesse.

Mrs. Robert Simmel of Pilot 
Point was her sister’s matron 
of honor and the groom’s sis­
ter Mrs. Harold Neu of Ma- 
dill, Okla., and Mrs. Pat Hess 
were bridesmaids. They wore 
dresses of sunshine yellow 
satin with A-line skirts and 
sleeveless bodices topped with 
short white lace jackets with 
elbow length sleeves. Their 
hats were two-tired bows of 
yellow satin and they carried 
baskets of yellow carnations.

Attending the groom were 
Harold Neu, best man, Robert 
Simmel and Pat Hess. Arthur 
Hess and Virgil Henscheid 
ushered. Candle lighters and 
acolytes were Steve Rohmer, 
Glenn Trachta, Alcuin Schill­
ing, Melvin Schilling and Stan­
ley Endres.

After mass the bride placed 
a bouquet of white gladioli 
on the Blessed Virgin’s altar.

Wedding reception and buf­
fet were in the Parish Hall. 
Registering relatives an d  
friends were Miss Frances 
Walterscheid and Mrs. C. J. 
Heilman. The wedding dance 
was in the VFW Hall.

When the couple left on 
their wedding trip, not reveal­
ing their destination, she was 
wearing a light yellow crepe 
suit with white accessories 
and the orchid lifted from her 
bridal bouquet. When they re­
turn they will be at home in 
Muenster. He works for Yos­
ten Sand & Gravel Co. She is 
employed in the bookkeeping 
department at Shamburger 
Lumber Co.

Both attended Sacred Heart 
High School and he served in 
the army four years with two 
years of overseas duty in Ger­
many.

OUT OF TOWN GUESTS
Among out of town guests 

were the bride’s grandmother, 
Mrs. John Eckart of Subiaco, 
her uncle and aunt, the Gilbert 
Eckarts and son of Midwest 
City, Okla., the groom’s bro­
ther and family, the Raymond 
Hesses of Denison; his sister, 
Sister Christina Hesse of Fort 
Worth, another sister and bro­
ther-in-law, Pvt. and Mrs. Jim 
Mvrick of Lawton.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Pelzel 
of Pilot Point, Miss Linda 
Schindler of Dallas, Messrs, 
and Mmes. Weldon Bezner, 
Melvin Voth and John Neu Jr. 
of Lindsay. Mr. and Mrs. Leo 
Felderhoff and Mr. and Mrs. 
C. J. Heilman of Gainesville.

Babysitting with their grand­
son this week are Mr. and 
Mrs. Edd McGannon. They 
have baby Karl Lins with 
them while his parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Gordon Lins are vaca­
tioning in New Orleans, La. 
They’ll return this weekend 
accompanied by Brother Char­
les McGannon and all will I 
spend a few days here. Bro­
ther Charles will accompany 
his sister and family to Kansas 
City, finish his vacation in 
Boston and go to Miamia, 
Florida, for the school term.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hoedebeck 
left Tuesday to return to San 
Diego, Calif., after being here 
for the funeral of his father 
Fred Hoedebeck and visiting 
with Muenster and Tishomin­
go, Okla., relatives.

Miss Hoedebeck, 
Clarence Zimmerer 
Set Wedding Date

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Hoedebeck, 
of Gainesville formerly of 
Muenster, have announced 
the engagement of their 
daughter, Miss Charlotte Hoe­
debeck, to Clarence Zimmerer, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. H. J. 
Zimmerer of Lindsay.

The couple will be married 
at 5 p.m., Saturday, Sept. 5, 
at St. Mary’s Catholic Church 
in Gainesville. A former class­
mate, Mrs. Charles Barnes of 
Gainesville will be Miss Hoe- 
debeck’s matron of honor, and 
Bill Zimmerer of Lindsay will 
attend his brother as best man.

In 1900 there were 30,000 
electric trolley cars in the U. S.

SPECIAL THIS WEEK
Living Room or Den Suite —  $169.95

Brown naugahyde. Couch embossed with 
Longhorn head, swivel rocker embossed with 
bucking bronc. Sturdy oak frames, oak arms,
3 strong oak tables, 2 cowboy boot lamps. 
Offer good this week only.

Your Hotpoint Dealer

Otts Furniture
Harold Otts, South Side Courthouse, Gainesville 

WE GIVE & REDEEM BUCCANEER STAMPS

EVERYDAY

5 lb. 29c

Philadelphia 8 oz.

Cream Cheese _ _ _ _ 29c
Shurfresh

Margarine . _ .  _ 3 lb. 49c
Gladiola

White Meal _ _ _ _ 5 lb. 29c 

Tea, Morton V4 lb. _ .  25c
Dutch Maid 1 lb. choc, or vanilla

Sugar Wafers _ _ _ _ 39c
Heinz strained

Baby Food . . . .  6-65c
Switf's Prem. 12 oz.

Lunch Meat .  . . . .  39c
Ireland No. 300 sliced or chipped

Barbecue _ _ _ _ _ 59c
French 24 oz.

Pure Mustard .  _ _ _ 29c
Kraft 18 oz. tumbler

Red Plum Preserves _ _ 39c
Kraft 18 oz. tumbler

Apricot Preserves _ _ _ 49c
Shurfine 7 oz. jar Spanish

Stuffed Olives _ _ _ .  39c

Aerowax, qt. _ _ _ .  59c 

Giant Fab . . . .  65c

P ^ ia d u c e

Fresh California

PEACHES
lb. 19c

Fresh California

PLUMS
lb. 19c

AF All Flavors

MELLORINE
Vi gal. 3-$1.00

Shurfine 6 oz.

LEMONADE
I 0 - $ 1 .0 0

Shurfine 10 oz.

VEGETABLES
19c

Libby's w.k. No. 303 Dove Bath Size

C O R N
2-29c

Beauty Bar Soap .  .  2—49c

Bakerite 3 lb. can

SHORTENING
59c

Employee Wanted
to work in our meat department

GOOD BEEF
for your freezer

from creep fed 
home killed calves 

whole or half carcass

Purina

DOG CHOW
- 5 lb. 69c

V

Wednesday Is 
Double Stamp Day

You get twice th* usual number of Buccaneer 
Stomps on W ednesday with the purchase oi 
$2.50 or more in groceries. (Cigarettes not In-

Phone 759-4211

FISHER’S
MARKET and GROCERY
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CLASSIFIED AD RATES 
Firil Insertion IS cents per line.

Minimum 60 cents 
Following Insertions 10 cents per 
tine. Minimum 40 cents 

Card of Thanks $1.00

LEG A L NOTICE RATES 
First Insertion 2 cents per word. 
Following Insertions I cent per word

THANKS
A few words of thanks to all 

my friends and relatives for 
the cards, letters, magazines, 
food, visits and inquiries a- 
bout my condition. — James 
Lutkenhaus.

Many thanks to all who re­
membered me with cards 
while I was in the hospital. 
They brought a lot of cheer. 
My family joins me in appre­
ciation for other favors. — 
Mrs. Frank Schilling.

Our heartfelt thanks to all 
who extended comforting sym­
pathy and help in our recent 
sorrow. The spiritual bouquets, 
flowers, food, the expressions 
of sympathy and other kind­
nesses are deeply appreciated. 
Special thanks to Father John 
for his visits. — The Family 
of Joe Fuhrmann.

FOR SALE
FOR SALE;

All of My 
Farm Equipment 
Norbert Koesler 36-2

CLOSEOUT SPECIAL, Leath­
erette seat covers. $16.95. Red, 
black and white combinations 
only. Fit most cars. White 
Auto Store. 36-1

GLASS: Plate, window, auto­
mobile, furniture tops, mirrors. 
Complete glass service. We 
handle insurance claims. Gain­
esville Glass Shop. H05-3321, 
311 N. Chestnut. 37tf

FOR SALE: twin size bed 
complete with innerspring 
mattress and springs, A-l. 
Ph. 759-2889, Mrs. Tony Otto.

36-2

Water Pumps
Now available 

in our stock 
Submersible Pumps 

Deep Well Jels 
Shallow Well Pumps

Stock Tanks
3 to 8 foot diameter

Wilson & Wilson
Gainesville

Fiberglass boat, 14 ft., 35 
H. P. motor and trailer for 
sale. Ph. Hugo Lutkenhaus, 
759-4373, Muenster. 33-tf

Water Pumps
Submersible 

V, H. P. to 40 H. P.

Plastic Pipe
A very inexpensive 
way to get water 
where you need it.

C. D. Shamburger 
Lumber Co.

Muenster

Bedding, Drapes
New mattresses, box springs 
renovations of innersprings 

and cotton mattresses 
Custom Made Drapes 

according to specifications 
All work guaranteed 

Free Pickup & Delivery 
Save as much as 50%

United Bedding Company
Gainesville

Call Mrs. Tony Hoenig
Ph. 759-4142, Muenster

Congoleum
Naim

LINOLEUM
SALE

New full rolls 
Newest patterns

12 feet wide

only 65c sq. yd.
THIS WEEK 

ONLY

B & B Sales
1 block North of Kress

Top Quality 
HUMBLE

MOTOR FUEL 
ENGINE OILS 

PAINTS

Atlas Tires 
and Batteries

T. C. Schneider, Agent
Gainesville, H05-5412 tf

One Ways
No. 2 International 

8, 10 and 14 disc 
S125 up

Tractor Mowers
John Deere and 

International 
$100 up

Silage Cutters
1 John Deere No. 7 

3 Allis Chalmers

Myers Cheaney 
& Thompson

Gainesville

TANKS. Septic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks, water tanks. 
Will install. Bayer Bros., Ph. 
759-4244, Muenster 6tf

Tires
For tractors, implements 

cars and trucks

Tom's
Fina Station

Muenster

Farm Eguipment
Late JD A tractor; Farmall 

H tractor; late MH 55 tractor; 
Case SC tractor; 1961 MF-82 
14 ft. combine; late 1959 MF- 
92 14 ft. combine; 12 ft. wind- 
rowers; balers; JD  and Ford 
mowers; drag and 3-point rak­
es; JD  3 or 4 disc plows; IHC 
4 disc plows; Alamo 3 and 5 
disc plow; Ford 2 bottom 
plows; JD 10 or 21 blade Sur- 
flex; IHC 5 to 14 blade one- 
ways; 10 ft. Haymie chisel; 
JD 3 pt chisel; 6 to 14 ft. tan­
dem discs; JD 14 to 16 hole 
fertilizer drills; JD harrows; 
21 ft. sprayer. Lawrence Zim- 
merer, Hwy. 51, H05-5636.

22 tf.

PIT
BARBECUE

Beef, Ribs, Ham
Let Us Serve 
Your Party

. . .  in our dining room 
or with our catering service

ROHMER'S
RESTAURANT

Muenster

Ceiling Tile
by Armstrong

in stock at
Community Lumber Co. 

MuenstGi

Garden and Lawn Needs
Complete supply of hoes, rak­
es, spades, hose, sprinklers, 
etc., also lawn mowers and 
roto tillers.
Community Lumber Co. 19tf

Bois d' Arc fence posts
in stock at

Community Lumber Co. 51tf
MOTORS, all sizes, for milk­

ing machines, water pumps, 
oil field equipment, etc. C. D 
Shamburger Lumber Co. 43tf

For Sale: 20-foot cattle- 
truck bed. Bayer Bros., Ph. 
759-4244.Muenster. 26tf

25% Discount
Leather Belts, Handbags 

Billfolds
Nick & Adelina Miller 17-tf

Kool King 
Air Conditioner

For Your Car
$219.00 terms

Installed and guaranteed 
for 1 year or 1200 miles

Sun
Rebuilt Engines

for Cars and Trucks
We buy direct from the 

factory and can sell reason­
ably. .

Heavy Duly All-Steel 
Lifetime Guarantee

Mufflers
Free Installation

Schmidlkofer
Garage

315 W. Elm. Just 
west of Market Square 
H05-3891, Gainesville

AUTHORIZED DEALERSHIP 
for

Hale Livestock Trailers 
S&S Calf Cradles 

S&S Branding Chutes

Muenster Livestock Auction
39tf

Good young registered Here­
ford and Angus bulls for sale 
at Muenster Livestock Auction.

Barbecue
In sandwiches or by the pound 
packages to go.

Johnny's 
B-29 Club

Across the river

Call
Dan Luke 
759-2522

FOR

BUTANE 
PROPANE 
FINA GAS 
FINA OIL

Shoes — Boots
Work - Dress • Western 

The New Home of

Nocona Boots 
I. R. Hocker

Men's 8c Boys' Store
207 N. Commerce 

Gainesville

WINDOW SHADES, with or 
without rollers, plastic or 
Clopay. Washable, cut to your 
size. Ben Franklin Store. 31tf

New Necchi-Elna 
Automatic 

Sewing Machine 
$147.50

NECCHI-ELNA 
SEWING CIRCLE 

309 E. Calif., H05-2524

CERAMIC TILE. New and 
old installation. For estimate 
call Ted Henscheid, 759-4280, 
Muenster. 5-tf

VENETIAN BLINDS
Repaired, Retaping and re­

cording. Tony Hoenig, Phone 
759-4142, Muenster 50tf

Veterinary
Vaccines

For every purpose. All vaccine 
is laboratory fresh, fully po­
tent, and guaranteed to be 
the best available. Ask about 
Globe’s new low prices on 
Calf vaccines. Watts Bros, in 
Gainesville.

DODGE 
Sales & Service

Used Cars & Pickups
All makes and models 
Paint and Body Shop 

24 hour wrecker service 
Boat rebuilding and repair

(glass, metal or wood)

Kubis Motor Co.
835 N. Grand, H05-9711 

Gainesville

Save at Flusche's 
Pipe & Salvage

Dealer in oxygen, acetylene, 
welding rods, new and used 
pipe, sucker rods, trash burning 
barrels. Also iron for gates, 
fence, cattle guards, bams, 
sheds, car ports, clothes line 
posts. Portable and shop weld­
ing. We buy any iron and met­
al. The home for “Tired Iron".

J. P. Flusche, Don Flusche 
Office ph. 753-2203, Res. 2205

Veterinary
Supplies

Vaccine, Antibiotics, Instru­
ments. Whatever your require­
ments, Watts Bros, has the 
complete Globe line, at new 
low prices. Watts features the 
world famous Gold label 
blackleg vaccine made by 
Globe — Now at a new low 
price.

FOR RENT
FOR RENT: 5-room house, 

garage, back yard fenced. 
Close to b o t h  Muenster 
schools. Palace Drug Store.

34-tf
HOSPITAL BEDS available 

for rent. Fee given to Muenster 
Hospital. See Muenster Phar­
macy. 32-tf

REAL ESTATE
FOR SALE: Bernauer prop­

erty, 5 lots and 2 houses, at a 
bargain. See L. A. Bernauer.

FOR SALE: 7 city lots on 
Sycamore St. paved, and curb­
ed. See Werner Cler or ph. 
759-4451. 35-2p

FOR SALE: Richter Estate 
with 22 lots. See Mrs. H. A. 
Walterscheid or Hugo Lutken­
haus. 31-6

HOUSE FOR SALE: modem 
3-bedroom, attached garage, 
central heat and air condition­
ing. See Joe Galloway. 34-tf

FOR SALE: 2 lots with 3- 
room house in city. Sell to­
gether or separately. See 
Henry Weinzapfel. 29-tf

Miss Judy Tompkins of 
Arlington enjoyed a vacation 
visit with her grandparents, 
the Victor Hartmans, last week.

SERVICE
CONCRETE WORK any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish 
ready mix concrete. Bayer 
Brothers. 28tf

Your Watch . . .
Ultrasonically cleaned 
and scientifically timed

Francis Wiese
at Kinne’s, Gainesville

TV, Radio and 
Antenna Service

CALL

Schad & Pulte
H05-4374 49tf

JACK CHEANEY'S 
SADDLE 8c SHOE SHOP

211 W. Elm 
in Temple Building 

Gainesville
ALL WORK GUARANTEED

Westinghouse
Appliances

<S Zenith TVs
Sales and Service

Radio <& TV Repair 

Muenster Butane
Ph. 759-4411

Expert
Watch Repair

HUNEYCUTT'S 
DISCOUNT JEW ELRY

116 N. Commerce 
Former Tappan’s Location

SHOE REPAIRS 
Cavalier & Esquire polish 

in all popular shades 
Nick & Adelina Miller 48-tf

ECONOMICAL 
Watch and Clock 

Repairs
All Work Guaranteed
Stan Chadwell

317 N. Commerce, Gainesville

Cleaning 
& Pressing

We pick up and deliver,
NICK & ADELINA

Ph. 759-4422, Muenster 48-tf

For the best Watch and 
Jewelry Repairs, come to 
Browning’s, Gainesville. S3tf

CUSTOM SPRAYING 
Anything. Anywhere 

Muenster Hatchery, 759-2766

LOST - FOUND
16 INCH WHEEL AND TIRE 

for trailer lost in or near Muen­
ster. Reward for return to 
Paul Endres, 759-4241. 35-3

LOST: one roll black in­
sulation, about 3 feet long, 
between Muenster and Myra. 
Please return to Shamburger 
Lumber Co., Muenster. 35-2

Political
Announcements

MRS. JO HILLIS 
JAMES WHALEY

Aug. 12 Is Date to 
Give Certificates

August 12 has been set by 
city librarians as the date to 
present reading certificates to 
children who qualify by read­
ing the required number of 
books during the summer.

In connection with the pres­
entation, librarians are plan­
ning a party with refresh­
ments.

Local News
B R I E F S

Mr. and Mrs. George Petrus 
entertained weekend guests 
from Ennis and Rhineland. 
Her parents Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Patak came from En­
nis returning Michael and Ron­
nie Petrus to their home af­
ter the boy’s vacation with 
their grandparents. Mr. and 
Mrs. Louis Redder and two 
children came from Rhineland.

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Holland 
and little son of Cleburne spent 
the weekend with her mother, 
Mrs. Bob Yosten.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Toothaker 
visited Sunday and Monday 
in Clifton with her sister and 
husband, the M. L. Lands-
fords.

While the Alvin Hartmans 
and children Monica an d  
Bobby were going to College 
Station and on their return 
after he attended the Fire­
men’s School at A&M, they 
stopped to see relatives and 
friends. In Waco they visited 
the Jerry Fettes, at Arlington 
they were overnight guests of 
the Keith Tompkins and picked 
up their little son Kenny who 
stayed there while they were 
away. The Harvey Schmitts 
took him to Arlington on their 
visit there last Thursday. Af­
ter that the Hartmans stopped 
at Denton to see the Willard 
Hartmans and at Gainesville 
for a pop call with the A. J . 
Felderhoffs.

Guests of the Henry Spaeths 
at Gainesville recently were 
George Dupree and Mrs. Shir­
ley Welch and children of 
Malvern, Ark., and Dupree’s 
grandson, Larry Dupree of 
Dallas.

Miss Rita Noggler has joined 
the personnel at the Charm 
Shop. She started as a sales­
lady Monday.

Miss Sharon Tompkins of 
Arlington had a visit here with 
her grandparents and is finish­
ing vacation time in Denton 
with the Willard Hartmans. 
She caught a ride to Denton 
with the Gene Hartmans when 
they returned Sunday after 
their visit here.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Lehn- 
ertz and son left Saturday after 
dividing their leave time a- 
mong his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Lehnertz, and his 
brothers, Jim in Gainesville, 
Giles in Tyler, and Earl in 
Bossier City, La. Floyd is in 
the Navy, stationed in Rhode 
Island.

Double S&H 
Green Stamps
every Wednesday 
with cash purchase 

of $2.50 or more

Free Delivery Any Time

We Invite 30 day  
charge accounts

MELLORINE, Swift's, Vi gal--------39c
Biscuits, White S w an_____ 3 for 25c
Coca Cola, king size, 6-pack —  35c

plus deposit

Whole New Potatoes, 303 --------- 10c
Spinach, 303 __________________ 10c
Shortening, White Swan, 3 lbs. ... 59c
Crackers, pound b o x _________ — 21c
Bremner Jumbo
Marshmallow Pies, box of 1 2 -------39c
New Sunbeam or Mrs. Baird's
Bread, large 1 Vi pound lo a f------25c
Cutlets______________________ lb. 69c
Hamburger .... ... lb. 39c, 3 lbs. $1.00
Slab Bacon, no rin d -------------- lb. 49c
Chuck Roast ________________lb. 39c

DOUBLE 
Green Stamps

on cash purchases 
of School Items

Pool's uniform slacks and shirts 
Buster Brown blue knit shirts 

Blue and white jeans, khakis 
Sport shirts, long and short sleeve

Materials, Sewing Accessories, 
Shoes, Sox, Anklets, Underwear

SELECT NOW AND LAY AWAY 
AVOID THE RUSH

Phone 759-4233

Pagel’s Store
Muenster ‘ '

Dependable 
Grinding & Mixing

BULK FEED SERVICE

“M-M” Quality Feeds
SEED GRAIN FERTILIZER

Muenster Milling Co.

QUITTING
BUSINESS

Close-Out Prices
on tractors, implements, 

parts, accessories, tools, etc.
ALL MERCHANDISE CASH 

NO RETURNS

Muens te r
Equipment  Co., inc.
Phone 759-2215 Muenster, Texas

n p H N
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IT HAPPENED 
25 YEARS AGO

July 28. 1939

Local soil conservation dis­
trict may be start of vast 
North Texas project, area 
proposed is Trinity watershed; 
counties affected will be Cooke, 
Denton, Montague, Grayson, 
Collin, Dallas, Tarrant and 
Wise. Civic League sets city 
clean up for next week. Model 
airplane enthusiasts plan mini­
ature air show. Father Francis 
and Herbert Meurer appear 
on radio program over Sher­
man station. Walterscheid 
threshing crew has end of 
season party. Rev. Conrad 
Herda and Francis Dieter es­
cape injury when car turns 
over. Martin Friske is tearing 
his present home down to re­
place it with a new structure.

Store Furs 
and Woolens 

in Safety 
in our 

Dry-Cold 
Storage Vault

MILLER'S
Cleaners & Hatters

Gainesville

L7V N D B A m

Mr. Fa rm e r- 
Mr. Rancher:

A recent study in this area 
has resulted in an upward 
adjustment in our loan val­
ues making it possible, in 
many cases, to make larger 
loans. For information about 
a loan on your farm or 
ranch come in soon— let us 
explain the many advan­
tages of a Land Bank loan.

gee
W. P. Waldrop. Mgr.
F.L.B.A. of Sherman 

P. O. Box 56, Ph. 893-3443 
or

Howeth's Abstracts
each Tuesday 
in Gainesville

20 YEARS AGO
July 28, 1944

Mrs. R. L. McNelley is ready 
to open hat shop. County 
voters show little interest in 
Saturday’s primary election; 
only 225 of Muenster’s 563 vot- 
ers go to the polls. Geneva 
Gremminger, Dolly Endres 
and Mildred Walterscheid at­
tend Summer School of Cath­
olic Action in San Antonio. 
Steve Moster, Otto Walter­
scheid, Arnold Schilling and 
Marty Klement get together in 
New Guinea, Seabee Tony 
Yosten writes from the Ad­
miralty Islands. Herbie Herr 
arrives in England. Vincent 
Becker is doing sea duty in 
the Atlantic. Vincent Trachta 
is serving with the Navy in 
Hawaii.

15 YEARS AGO
July 29, 1949

Public School authorities 
launch intensive enrollment 
drive t0 acquire at least the 
minimum enrollment needed 
to qualify as a first class affil­
iated high school. Injuries re­
ceived in crash are fatal to 
Paul Himmels of Windthorst, 
formerly of Muenster. Mmes. 
David Trachta and Joe Lutt- 
mer have major surgery. Mari­
lyn Gremminger represents 
Muenster at Montague Grape 
Festival. Jake Horn and Cot­
ton Schmitz open watermellon 
stand next to Texaco Station. 
The Mike Tarantolas return 
from Japan. Engagement of 
Johnann Seyler and Lambert 
Bezner is announced. The Al­
bert Kubis family is fishing at 
Bay City this week.

10 YEARS AGO
July 30, 1954

City petition will ask cost 
survey and bond election for 
swimming pool. Radar is in­
troduced to check speeding on 
Texas highways. H. H. Homs- 
ley named superintendent 
and Mrs. Homsley is engaged 
as teacher at Muenster Public 
School. Mrs. A. R. Andress of 
Myra, 64, dies after extended 
illness. Sister Philippa is new 
superior at Jonesboro convent. 
Rosina Pelzel and Leo Felder- 
hoff marry at Pilot Point. C. 
L. Sutton and Mary Bridges 
of Myra marry. Fifteen 4-H 
clubbers from Muenster ac­
companied by Mrs. Martin 
Bayer and Rev. Christopher 
Paladino attend three-day 
summer camp at Lake Trini­
dad.

5 YEARS AGO
July 31. 1959

Slow but steady progress is 
noted in fund for local dress 
factory. Mild temperature and 
good moisture continue in this 
area. Plans revealed for auto­
matic laundry to adjoin Hof- 
bauer’s Store. J. W. Tippie of 
Whitesboro replaces Emmitt 
Yoder in local SCS unit. Joe 
Moster represents Fire De­
partment at A&M training 
school. Mary Trubenbach Vir­
ginia Wolf and Marlene 'B ez­
ner get nursing diplomas in 
Fort Worth. Mrs. Amanda 
Parker, 98, who lived in Myra 
78 years, dies suddenly. New 
grandstand is under construc­
tion on parochial field. Best 
year to date is reported at an­
nual meeting of NTPA. Jo 
Ann Hacker and Donald Pel­
zel marry. Lindsay St. Anne’s 
society welcomes 14 new 
members in services observing 
the feast of St. Anne.

PUBLIC NOTICE
Proposed CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENT

N UM BER ONE ON TH E BA LLO T
PROPOSED C O N S T I T U ­

T I O N A L  AMENDMENT 
TO BE VOTED ON AT AN 
ELECTION TO BE HELD 
ON NOVEMBER 3, 1964. 
SENATE JOINT RESOLU­

TION NO. 6 proposing an 
amendment to Section 5 of 
Article VII of the Constitution 
of the State of Texas so as to 
remove the authorization to 
transfer not exceeding one per 
cent annually of the total 
value of the permanent school 
fund to the available school 
fund.
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE 

LEGISLATURE OF THE 
STATE OF TEXAS:
Section 1. Section 5 of Ar­

ticle VII of the Constitution of 
the State of Texas is amended 
to read as follows:

“Section 5. The principal of 
all bonds and other funds, and 
the principal arising from the 
sale of the lands hereinbefore 
set apart to said school fund, 
shall be the permanent school 
fund, and all the interest de­
rivable therefrom and the 
taxes herein authorized and 
levied shall be the available 
school fund. The available 
school fund shall be applied 
annually to the support of the 
public free schools. And no 
law shall ever be enacted ap­
propriating any part of the 
permanent or available school 
fund to any other purpose 
whatever; nor shall the same, 
or any part thereof ever be

appropriated to or used for the 
support of any sectarian 
school; and the available
school fund herein provided 
shall be distributed to the sev­
eral counties according to their 
scholastic population and ap­
plied in such manner as may 
be provided by law.’'

Section 2. The foregoing 
Constitutional Amendment 
shall be submitted to a vote 
of the qualified electors at an 
election to be held on the first 
Tuesday after the first Mon­
day in November, 1964, at 
which election all ballots shall 
have printed thereon the fol­
lowing:

“FOR the Constitutional 
Amendment to remove the 
authorization to transfer 
not exceeding one per cent 
annually of the total value 
of the permanent school 
fund to the available 
school fund,”
“AGAINST the Constitu­
tional Amendment to re­
move the authorization to 
transfer not exceeding 
one per cent annually of 
the total value of the per­
manent school fund to the 
available school fund.” 
Section 3. The Governor of 

Texas shall issue the neces­
sary proclamation for the elec­
tion and this amendment shall 
be published in the manner and 
for the length of time as re­
quired by the Constitution and 
laws of this State.

BIG BORE—It’s a big bore 
to anyone e x c e p t  these 
Houston, Tex., children. It’s 
a bore of the largest oil 
pipeline Yalve ever built.

Queen Ann, Chomp 
Of Tennessee Show 
Wins 3 Trophies

Queen Ann, the Ernest 
Medders’ young Appaloosa 
mare from Colonial Acres 
Farm, walked off with grand 
championship honors at the 
Tennessee State Appaloosa 
Club Horse Show Saturday.

In addition to the champion­
ship trophy she captured two 
other trophies for the trophy 
room at Colonial Manor. She 
was first in her class and first 
in the Western Pleasure Class.

The show in Covington, 
Tenn., drew a large number 
of entries. The Medders’ sons 
Gene and John Riggs were 
there to see their entry win 
the three trophies. She also 
has captured champ trophies 
this season in Texas, Okla­
homa, Arkansas and New 
Mexico.

Sanders Jewelry
107 S. Commerce, G’ville

Local News
B R I E F S

S ster Geraldine and Sister 
Julia have returned to the 
local convent and are start­
ing to ready things for the 
fall term at Sacred Heart 
School. Sister Geraldine didn’t 
have much vacation this sum­
mer She taught chemistry in 
summer school at Holy Angels 
Convent in Jonesboro, Ark.

Sisters of St. Mary’s School 
at Gainesville have returned 
to their home after spending 
six weeks in study and teach­
ing in San Antonio and Dallas. 
Sister Angela Marie was at In­
carnate Word and Sister Agnes 
Joseph was at Our Lady of 
the Lake in San Antonio. Sis­
ter Amata taught religion at 
the Holy Rosary Parish in San 
Antonio and Sister Gloria 
Marie was at the University 
of Dallas.

Visiting with the Leo Sick- 
ings are their son-in-law and 
daughter S.Sgt. and Mrs. James 
Fights and little son Keith 
coming from Fort Worth and 
enroute to his new assign­
ment in Maine. He has been 
stationed at Carswell Air 
Force Base. His new location 
will be Loring Air Force Base. 
After their visit here they will 
stop with his relatives in Ken­
tucky on their way to Lime­
stone, Maine.

Ervin Hamric had a full 
schedule Sunday rounding up 
his grandsons. He left early 
by private plane to get Mich­

ael Hamric at Norman, Okla., 
and bring him back to spend 
a wegk here . . . made it in 
time to be joined by Mrs. 
Hamric for a car trip to Dallas 
to meet Mrs. Dan Hamric and 
son Robert of Anthony, N. M., 
as they arrived by plane at 
noon at Love Field. They are 
on vacation, coming ahead of 
Dan who will join them this 
weekend when his vacation 
starts.

Larry Gobble spent the 
weekend in Dallas visiting 
Kenneth Klein.

Friday visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Linn were four gen­
erations of friends from Fort 
Worth: Mrs. J . A. Sanders, 
former resident, Mrs. W. D. 
Cooke and Mrs. Doug Holcomb 
and three children.

Sunday visitors and dinner 
guests of the J  D Hannas 
were their children and fam­
ilies, the J. Dan Hannas and 
daughters Pam, Kay and 
Diana and the latter’s friend, 
Mary Kay King, and the Ran- 
day Hambricks and son Gree. 
all of Marietta, Okla., and 
Mr. Hanna’s aunt Mattie, Mrs. 
E. C. McElroy of Denton. Mrs. 
McElroy stayed over until 
Tuesday for a longer visit.

Chris and Phil Kupper left 
Saturday to. return to Marlin 
after a four-week visit with 
their grandparents, the Wer­
ner Endreses and other rela­
tives. Chris worked on the hay 
baler with his uncle Paul En­
dres. Phil had a fun vacation 
with his cousins.

There are two times in a 
man’s life when he shouldn’t 
speculate; when he can’t afford 
it, and when he can.

SUMMER
Specials

on

Delta Tires
ONE DAY DELIVERY ON ANY SIZE 

MOST SIZES IN STOCK

All sizes of tires for 
tractors and farm equipment

Hess Sinclair Station
Muenster

Wife — “I think, you might 
talk to me while I sew.” 

Husband — “Why don’t you 
sew to me while I read?”

The mockingbird was des­
ignated the state bird of Texas 
by the Texas Legislature on 
January 31, 1927.

Flowers for  Every Occasion
Since 1884 It's

KADEN, The Florist
Flowerphone H05-4354, Gainesville

Represented in Muenster by Mrs. Nick Miller

FIRE — AUTO — LIABILITY

INSURANCE
BOOKKEEPING SERVICE NOTARY PUBLIC

Leo Henscheid Insurance Agency
Ph. 759-2844. North Main St., next door to City Hadl

S P E C I A L  
This W eek Only

King Size 
Mattresses

Simmons Innerspring 
or

Lifetime Foam Mattress
(Full 6 inches of foam)

Complete with 
Box Springs

only $149.50

NEWLAND FURNITURE CO.
201 N. Dixon, Gainesville

Visit Six Flags Over Texas tnia summer. 
More than a hundred acres of fun for 
everyone. Be sure to include a ride on 
Humble’s “Happy Motoring” Freeway. 
Even youngsters can safely steer the  
miniature sports cars. Stop at your Enco 
dealer’s before you go. He has coupons 
for you, each worth 501 on a child’s ticket 
for Six Flags.

hNO, EMMA...
ITS IN THE GASOLINE'/

NEW HIGH-ENERGY ENCO EXTRA GASOLINE BOOSTS POWER THREE W AYS:
1 Cleaning Power! Dirt can clog even a new 

carburetor in a few months of normal opera­
tion—causing hard starting and rough idling. 
Your very first tankful of New Enco Extra will 
start to clear away these deposits—in new engines 
or old—to improve power and mileage.

Firing Power! Spark plug and cylinder de­
posits can cause misfiring, pre-ignition and 

hot spots. New Enco Extra neutralizes these 
harmful deposits—to help your engine fire 
smoothly, to help preserve the power of new cars 
and restore lost power to many older cars.

M AKERS O E  EN C O  P R O D U C TS  A N D  
SUPPLIERS O F  EN C O  RACING F U E L S  
T H A T  POW ERED A . J . F O Y T  A N D

3 Octane Power! New Enco Extra has the 
high octane that most cars now need for full 

smooth performance without knocking.
You’ll get a ll these extras with New Power- 

formula Enco Extra gasoline—it puts a tiger in 
your tank! A ftU m f/

HUMBLE
O IL «< REFINING C O M P A N Y

•  M U M B L E  O I L  A  B E H N P N O  C O M P A N Y , IB B 4

RO DG ER W A R D  T O  F IR S T  A N D  S E C ­
O N D  P L A C E  IN T H IS  Y EA R 'S  INDIAN­
A P O LIS  500 M EM OR IAL D A Y  C LA S S IC
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A passenger on The Limited, 

looking under his berth in the 
morning, found one black shoe 
and one tan. He called the 
porter’s attention to the error. 
The porter scratched his head 
in bewilderment. “Well, if 
that don’t beat all,” he said. 
“That’s the second time this 
morning that mistake’s hap­
pened!”

FOR YOUR FARM NEEDS

Gasoline, Oil, Supplies, etc. 
Call Gulf Oil Corporation 

Jimmy Lehnertz, Dist. 
H05-4562 — HO5-5420

Gainesville
Or see your local dealer 
Ferd Luttmer, Muenster

Overcomes Horse
A foreign Communist was 

being honored at a state din­
ner in Russia and became 
perturbed when he extracted 
a piece of rubber tire from 
his soup. A secret policeman 
noted his concern.

Recovering his composure 
he raised the rubber on his 
spoon saying: “Imagine, only 
35 years in power, and the 
automobile is replacing the 
horse!”

Garbage should be treated 
as a valuable national re­
source, say geologists at the 
City College of New York. 
They contend that waste 
should be processed into “com­
post” for use in agriculture 
and horticulture. This would 
decrease incidence of pollution 
and pest infestation, could be 
a source of profit, and would 
aid in conservation, the geolo­
gists say.

Marysville News
By Mrs. John Richey

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Robison 
and son Jimmy and grand­
children Jan and Mark Robi­
son visiting from Spur spent 
the weekend in Houston after 
meeting their son and his wife 
the Douglas Robisons at Col­
lege Station Friday. They saw 
the last two games of the 
Houston Colts and Chicago 
Cubs Saturday and Sunday 
nights. During the day Sunday 
they went to Galveston. Jan 
and Mark accompanied their 
parents back to Spur.

Mr. and Mrs. W. F. David­
son and Mrs. Charles David­
son and daughters Patricia and 
Kathy joined other relatives 
Saturday evening for a patio 
supper at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Dunnam at Whites- 
boro. The Dunhams are newly­
weds. She is the former Eliza­
beth Roe of Callisburg, grand­
daughter of the W. F. David­
sons.

Brother Taylor dispensed 
with the evening services at 
the Baptist Church Sunday in 
order to attend the county 
wide Crusade for Christ in 
Gainesville. Attending with 
the pastor and his family were 
Mr. and Mrs. Rafe McElreath 
and Becky and Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady McElreath.

Mr. and Mrs. W. F. David­
son visited their former neigh­
bors, the Jim Shiflets, in 
Gainesville Thursday after­
noon.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Win­
chester left Monday to visit 
several days in Dallas and Ar­
lington with their children.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Spark­
man and son Sammy were in 
Era Thursday at the funeral 
of his uncle J. G. Roberson.

The Rev. and Mrs. Gene 
Hawkins and children of 
Lockney were Wednesday 
night guests of the Rafe Mc- 
Elreaths.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tuggle 
and Ricky visited Saturday 
evening in Saint Jo  with Mr. 
and Mrs. Eddie Joe Reeves.

Sunday visitors with the 
Rafe McElreaths were Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Biffle of Myra.

Sunday dinner guest in the 
Sam Sparkman home was the 
Rev. Orval Cogdill, following 
services at Shiloh Baptist 
Church.

The Rev. and Mrs. Delbert 
Taylor and daughters of Fort 
Worth had Sunday dinner with 
the Grady McElreaths after 
services at Marysville Baptist 
Church.

Mmes. Sam Sparkman, Al­
bert Fleitman and George 
Ritcherson visited Friday in 
Sherman with Mrs. Orval Cog- 
dill of Gainesville who is a 
patient at Wilson N. Jones 
Hospital since last Wednesday. 
She had bone surgery. Her 
room number is 404 and cards 
will cheer her.

V. M. Ramsey spent Friday 
in Gainesville with his daugh­
ter Mrs. Willis Robison.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Coch­
ran of Denton spent the week­
end with her brother-in-law 
and sister, Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Tuggle.

Vacation Bible School is 
scheduled for Marysville Bap­
tist Church to begin August 
10. Bro. and. Mrs. Delbert 
Taylor and Mrs. Rafe McEl­
reath will be teachers, assisted 
by other members of the 
church.

Sunday visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. George Ritcherson were 
her brother and sister, Cary 
Johnson and Mrs. Dovie Pond, 
both of Wichita Falls. Joining 
them for visiting were the 
Ernest McElreaths and family.

A summer revival is being 
held this week at Shiloh Bap­
tist Church with a former 
pastor, the Rev. L. A. LaMance 
of Waco as evangelist assisted 
by the pastor, Bro. Orval Cog- 
dill of Gainesville. Welcome 
is extended to attend the ser­
vices.

SEE US BEFORE YOU . . .
Buy, Build or Repair a  Home, 
or Open a  Savings Account

H E S P E R IA N
BUILDING & SAVINGS ASSN.

Serving Cooke County Residents since 1890
111 E. California, H05-3486, Gainesville

Registered Black Angus Cattle
Young bulls for sale. Some ready for 

service. Reasonably priced.

Also Registered Red Angus Cattle

VISITORS WELCOME 

COLONIAL ACRES FARM
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Medders, Muenster

G a tftjile te

P ltc iS u tu jX X f, S e s u U c e

MUENSTER PHARMACY
J D Hanna, Registered Pharmacist

HURRY !
There’s a great buy waiting 

for you at your Chevrolet dealer’s

C hevy  Z7 N ova 2-D oor S edan

Your Chevrolet one-stop shopping center is the one 
place in town where you’ve got your pick of up to 
45 different ways to be a homecoming hero for the 
rest of this sum m er-and for many more after.

Ju s t follow the crowds. You can’t miss it.
Check the display window out for A m erica’s No. 1 

automobile, the ’64 Jet-sm ooth Chevrolet. Any car 
th is luxurious should have its price examined.

Look for the brand-new young-at-heart, young-in­
price Chevelle—the only car that could come between 
Chevrolet and Chevy II.

C orvair Monza Club Coupe

Look for the fun-loving rear-engine Corvair. I t ’s 
Chevrolet’s answer to leaving summer sand, w inter 
snow and spring mud right in its tracks.

Look for the th rifty , room y  Chevy II. I t ’s the per­
fect automobile for summer economy drives.

Look for Am erica’s only true sports car, Corvette.
Test drive the one that turns you on most.
Then start talking price.
I t ’s the greatest cure-all for 

new car fever in the automo­
tive world.

BECAUSE MORE PEOPLE BUY CHEVROLETS, CHEVROLETS MUSI BE A BETTER BUY
43-5828

WILDE CHEVROLET COMPANY
East Hy. 82 & Mesquite. Muenster, Texas Phone 759-2261

Becky, Barby, and Mike 
Davidson are vacationing at 
Wills Point with their uncle 
and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. H. B. 
Snow. The children went back 
with them when they returned 
after attending the funeral 
of her aunt, Mrs. J. N. Shaw 
at Gainesville and visiting 
Marysville relatives.

Gary, Jerry and Denise 
Doughty of Gainesville visited 
two days last week with their 
grandparents, the Joe Dough- 
tys.

Little Paula Hickman who 
had open heart surgery June 
5 at Texas Childrens Hospital 
in Dallas was back for a check­
up last Friday and got a good 
report. She’s progressing sat­
isfactorily and will have her 
next checkup in four months. 
Mrs. Paul Hickman and Nancy 
and Tammy went with Paula 
and visited at the home of the 
Paul Hickmans at Carrollton. 
Mrs. Paul Hickman came for 
them Friday and brought them 
back Saturday.

55 Attend Annual 
Biniord Reunion

Children and other relatives 
of the late Mr. and Mrs. Clem 
Binford gathered at the old 
homeplace for their annual 
weekend reunion. Fifty-five 
attended. They started arriv­
ing Friday and broke camp 
Sunday afternoon. Those at­
tending came from Washing­
ton, Okla., Duncan, Purcell, 
Midwest City and Norman, 
Okla., Tyler, Fort Worth, 
Chandler, Van, Decatur and 
Gainesville.

Present were Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry P. Morehead, Mr. and 
Mrs. John A. Morehead and 
daughter Lora, Mr. and Mrs. 
L. B. Collins and children 
Mike, Jamathew and Larry, 
all of Washington, Okla.; Mr. 
and Mrs. Ralph Budlong and 
children Terry and Annette 
and Teresa Woodall of Dun­
can, Okla.; Mr. and Mrs. Bin- 
ford Morehead and children 
Danny, Darrell and Randy of 
Purcell, Okla.

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Nantz 
and daughters Debbie, Becky 
and Cindy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Young and children 
Barbara and Glenn, all of 
Tyler; Mr. and Mrs. A. Z. 
Branch and Mr. and Mrs. 
David E. Tupman-and children 
Kathy and Keith of Fort 
Worth; Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bin- 
ford and daughter Loma of 
Gainesville.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Young 
of Chandler, Texas; Mr. and 
Mrs. Donald Young and chil­
dren Dick, Ken, Susan and 
Russell of Van; Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin E. White and daugh­
ter Lora Jean of Midwest City, 
Okla., Mr. and Mrs. Henry A. 
Morehead and children James 
and Joan of Norman, Okla., 
and Mr. and Mrs. Dwaine Bin- 
ford of Decatur.

‘Mystery drownings’ - where 
the victim was a good swim­
mer in excellent health - can 
occur when the breath is held 
too long under water, accord­
ing to a study by the Univer­
sity of Rochester School of 
Medicine. When the body’s 
store of carbon dioxide is re­
duced, the report states, the 
urge to breathe is delayed, the 
body’s supply of oxygen be­
comes insufficient and con­
sciousness fades. The swim­
mer may pass out so quickly 
that other persons present may 
not realize he’s in trouble un­
til it’s too late.

2 Cousins Share 
Birthday Honors
Donna Barnes returned to her 
home at Era Thursday even­
ing, her uncle and aunt, the 
John Richeys taking her back 
after a ten-day vacation with 
them.

When they arrived at Don­
na’s home they found a yard 
full of relatives and friends 
waiting to celebrate Donna’s 
birthday. Sharing honors with 
her was a cousin, Bobby 
Richey of Sivells Bend. Both 
have July 23 birthdays. Bobby 
was 13 and Donna was 11.

Mr. and Mrs. John Barnes 
were hosts for their daughter 
and nephew and served home­
made ice cream and birthday 
cake. Afterward croquet and 
42 games were enjoyed. Both 
honorees received gifts.

Present were the Fred 
Richeys and Larry and the 
Robert Richeys and family of 
Sivells Bend, the D. A. and the 
Donald Thompsons and son 
Randy, Mrs. Raymond Reed 
and children Scott and Jana 
and Mrs. Earl Cochran, all of 
Gainesville, the Martin Millers 
and family of Era, the John 
Richeys of Marysville and the 
John Barnes family.

No matter what your age, 
the years have got you down 
when it takes you longer to 
rest up than it did to get 
tired.

Save Time! 
Save Money!

Shop the 
Drive-In Window 

for all your prescription* 
and drug needs

WATTS
Prescription Shop

302 N. Grand, Gainesville
Prescription Is Our 

Middle Name

Silver dollars aren’t the only 
coins in short supply. Mint 
officials say the supply of 
change in circulation has been 
dwindling for years and that 
four billion more coins are 
needed just to meet present 
demands. Vending machines, 
increased uses for silver in in­
dustry, the growing number 
of coin collectors, hoarders, 
silver speculators and fear that 
Uncle Sam might replace silver 
coin with base metals are cited 
as reasons for the shortage.

H.O. Kinne,0.D.
OPTOMETRIST

210 E. Colli.. Gainesville
State License No. 26

Dr. J. W. Middleton
CHIROPRACTOR

In Muenster
Tues.. Thurs.. Sat.

408 N. Oak, Ph. 759-4312

Open Tuesday 
thru Saturday

Dorothy’s 
Fashionette 

Beauty Salon
303 S. Chestnut 

Gainesville

Beauty Is Not A Gift . . .
It's A Habit"

am deed? WHERE
I S . . .

th at Ltt&i?

$ %V
n u j, tm m ance?

Answers to questions such as the above 
are “filed aw ay” in your mind. B u t—will 
they pop up when needed? For pennies a 
week—literally—you can keep all your val­
uables im m ediately available in our Safe 
Deposit vault. A ct now, lest you forget!

MUENSTER STATE BANK
Member FDIC

I fU L c r x L e ji- J ijA jjr u i—

EVAPORATIVE COOLER

LO W  Initial Cost 
LOW  Operating Cost 
LOW  Maintenance Cost

BUILT TO LAST,
LAST, LAST !! !

★  New Roto Control

★  Push-Button Switches

★  Asphalt Wrinkle Undercoat 
on Interior

★  Elegant Plastic Louvers ★  Plastic Base Pump

Complete line of parts for your cooler —  pads, pumps, floats, plastic and

copper line, fittings.

SHAMBURGER LUMBER COMPANY
Dick Trachta, Mgr.

\
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Lindsay News

Craft Club groups headed 
by Mrs. Norbert Rohmer and 
Mrs. A1 Bengfort had a splash 
party and picnic last Wednes­
day at Muenster pool and park. 
Mrs. Harold Schmitz assisted 
th e  leaders. Twenty-eight 
youngsters were present. They 
took sack lunches with them 
and the leaders served cold 
drinks.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Kubis 
Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Felderhoff 
and daughters Carol and 
Cindy, and Darlene Wolf of 
Muenster, have returned from 
a trip to San Antonio. They 
attended the diamond jubilee 
of Sister M. Fortunata, aunt 
of Albert Kubis. The cere­
monies were Sunday. Cindy 
Felderhoff carried the diamond 
jubilee crown in the procession. 
They also enjoyed a tour of 
Our Lady of the Lake Con­
vent, the Alamo, Brackenridge 
Park and other places of inter­
est.

Visiting over the weekend 
with Mrs. Lena Arend were

her son and his wife, the Bill 
Arends and sons Billy and 
Jimmy of Perry ton. They also 
visited other relatives includ­
ing Bill’s sister, Mrs. Larry 
Yosten and family in Muen­
ster. Sunday all the family got 
together for visiting at the 
home of Mrs. Lena Arend. 
When the Arends left to re­
turn to Perryton they took 
Connie and Alane Yosten with 
them for a week’s vacation.

A two-car caravan brought 
folks from San Antonio this 
week to visit the Rauschuber 
relationship in Lindsay, Val­
ley View and Muenster. The 
visitors w ho plan to re­
turn home this weekend are 
Mrs. John Bukowski, her three 
daughters and four grand­
children. The daughters are 
Mmes. Allen Long, Calvin 
Sanders and Marie Maddox, all 
of San Antonio.

Mrs. John Fuhrmann of New 
Braunfels enjoyed visiting 
Lindsay relatives and her bro­
ther and family, the J . P. 
Kneuppers at Gainesville dur­
ing the weekend. She was a 

i delegate to the Catholic State 
League convention at Lindsay 
where a plaque was presented 
to the Kneupper family in 
memory of the late Herman 
Kneupper for 33 years of faith­
ful service to the insurance 
branch of the League.

The Bezner nuns, daughters 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jake Bezner, 
have been assigned for the 
coming school year. Sister Ra­
mona is back in San Antonio, 
Sister Kathleen has returned 
to Ennis and Sister Anna Rose 
has been transferred to Tulsa, 
Okia. She was in Alexandria, 
La., last year.

BEFORE BUYING 
INSURANCE

. . . it Is important to know U 
your agent will be available to 
assist you on claim settlements. 
WE WILLI

For professional insurance service see

Weinzapfel Insurance Agency
Herbert Meurer J. M. Weinzapfel Earl Fisher 
Representing only the old line stock companies

DANCE
Gainesville VFW Hall 

Saturday Night, Aug. 1

Music by Billy Owen 
And The Silver Stars

No Slacks or Blue leans Allowed

Open 1:45

STATE
■ ! ! ! ■ !  lll.'l l l i H ' l l l l  ! ■

NOW thru Sat.

'Honeymoon
Hotel"

Sunday through Tuesday

"South Pacific"
Saturday at the Hi-Ho Drive-In 

"Dragstrip Riot" & "Thunder in Carolina''

Sun. thru Tues. at the Hi-Ho Drive-In 
"Lady and the Tramp''

Hot 
Deal!

Closeout Prices 
on All ’64 Cars

We're making room 
for the '65 models

Come now while 
selections are better

Endres 
Motor Co.

Muenster

Coming for the funeral of 
their uncle, Joe Fuhrmann, 
and remaining for visits with 
their father, Mike Fuhrmann, 
and other relatives were Sis­
ters Henry Ann and Michael 
Marie Fuhrmann. Sister Henry 
Ann has recently been trans­
ferred from Madonna Hospital 
in Denison to San Antonio. 
Sister Michael Marie who has 
a longer visit with her father, 
will report to Laredo when 
the fall term starts. She taught 
in Iota, La., last year.

Father Aloys Fuhrmann who 
had major surgery about three 
weeks ago is reported recover­
ing normally in a Little Rock, 
Ark., hospital. He is pastor at 
Shoals Creek, Ark., and the 
son of Mike Fuhrmann.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Hess 
and daughter Margie visited 
one day recently with her 
cousin and family, the Paul 
Schmidlkofers. Paul is sta­
tioned at Perrin Air Force 
Base.

Eleven members of St. 
Annes’ Society of Lindsay re­
ceived 50-year gold pins as 
charter members of the Cath­
olic State League Women’s 
Union. They are Mmes. Mar­
garet Bezner, Elizabeth Spaeth, 
Emilee Hundt, Elizabeth Neu, 
Anna Prescher, Anna Lueb- 
bert, Lucy Fuhrmann, Anna 
Schmitz, Elizabeth Kubis, 
Katie Zimmerer and Anna 
Loerwald.

Sister Anna Rose and three 
other nuns from San Antonio 
stopped Tuesday for a visit 
with her parents, the Jake 
Bezners. They were on their 
way to Tulsa where they are 
assigned for the school term.

Committee to Meet
Lindsay Craft Club’s Gold 

Bond committee will meet 
Monday, August 3, at 2:30 in 
the home of Mrs. Ray Laux 
The banquet tables, secured 
through Gold Bond points by 
the club and donated to the 
parish, were in almost con­
stant use during the State 
League Convention.

Abbot Officiates 
At Niece Baptism

Abbot Alfred Hoenig offici­
ated at baptism of a grand­
niece, Daveta Stacey Gilley, 
infant daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. David Gilley, Gainesville, 
who was christened Monday 
evening in St. Mary’s Church.

Assisting a s godparents 
were the baby’s uncle and aunt, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Otto of 
Gainesville.

Others attending the ser­
vice included the grandpar­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Otto of Muenster and Father 
Harry Fisher, assistant pastor 
of St, Mary’s presently in 
charge of the parish while the 
pastor is on vacation. He was 
a special guest afterward at 
a christening party for the 
family in the Tommy Otto 
home.

Abbot Alfred returned to 
Corpus Christi Tuesday morn­
ing. He had been in Lindsay 
at the Catholic State League 
convention.

Miss Alice Voth 
And Robert David 
To Marry Sept. 19

— Boyd and Breeding Photo

Mr. and Mrs. John Voth of 
Lindsay have announced the 
engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter 
Alice to Robert David Jr., son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Robert David 
of Tioga.

The ceremony is planned for 
September 19, 4 p.m., in St. 
Peter’s Church at Lindsay.

Miss Voth is a graduate of 
Lindsay High School and is 
employed in the office of Cliff 
McMahon Appliance Co. in 
Gainesville. Mr. David is a 
graduate of Pilot Point Gee 
High School and is employed 
by Hilz Ford Sales in Pilot 
Point.

Confetti - - -
deserve respect? Now is the 
time for big shots of the 
colored race to show some real 
leadership and some real con­
cern for justice. They’ve had 
the law changed to suit them. 
Next they ought to change 
some of their followers to suit 
the law.

Catholic League -
golden anniversary of the 
founding of the women’s sec­
tion of the Catholic League, 
with which the mothers’ so­
cieties of Muenster and Lind­
say are affiliated. At one of 
its sessions the women’s sec­
tion presented 50 year gold 
pins to all charter members, 
including nineteen from Muen­
ster and eleven from Lindsay.

In the election of officers 
in the women’s section Mrs. 
A1 Walterscheid was named 
the state vice president.

The Catholic Life Insurance 
Union, insurance section of the 
State League, ended its part 
of the convention by present­
ing three burses for the edu­
cation of young men to the 
priesthood. Recepients were 
Bishop Gorman, Abbot Alfred 
and Abbot Michael.

The principal meeting lor 
the younger set was the 
Youth rally Saturday night. It 
was featured by a talk on Ex­
tension Lay Volunteers by 
Frank Cooney. He explained 
how these volunteers sign up 
for a year of service in a 
school, hospital, orphanage or 
some other charitable institu­
tion. In the announcement of 
rural life essay winners, four 
were included from the North 
Texas district. Bobby Zim­
merer of Lindsay, second in 
Junior Boys; Sandy Wolf of 
Windthorst, second in Junior 
Girls; Tommy Zimmerer of 
Lindsay second in Senior Boys; 
Peggy Schroeder of Wind­
thorst, second in Senior Girls.

First singing society in Texas, 
the “Germania,” w as or­
ganized in New Braunfels on 
March 2, 1850.

Total
Prescription

Service

Full supplies to fill prescriptions 
from out of town specialists.

Prices fair to the patient, always 
our first consideration.

Professional personnel to offer 
fast and efficient service.
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Gainesville

Friday and Saturday Specials

FLOUR5
With $2.50 purchase

f t

Betty Crocker, all flavors, mix or match

Cake Mixes or
Cake Frostings _ - 3—$ 1.00
Energy Vi gal.

B L E A C H _____ 29c
Del Monte 14 oz.

Catsup _ .  _ .  6-$1.00
Del Monte No. 303

P E A S _ _ _ _ _ 5-$100
Del Monte 46 oz.

Pineapple-
Grapefruit Drink _ 3—$ 1.00
Del Monte 46 oz.

Tomato Juice .  .  3—$ 1.00
Morton 4 oz. can

BLACK PEPPER. .  29c

WE GIVE

G R E E N  
STAM PS.

DOUBLE 
STAMPS ON 
WEDNESDAY
With grocery purchase 

of $2.50 or more (no 
cigarettes) on Wednesday 

we give twice as many 
S&H Green Stamps

Shurfine 18 oz.

Apple Jelly, Grape Jelly 
or Grape Jam _ _ _ 3—$1.00
Shurfine 12 oz.

Del Monte 46 oz.

PINEAPPLE
JUICE
2-69c

PEANUT BUTTER .  3-$l
Wilderness No. 2

Cherry Pie Filling .  . _ 39c
Shurfine 3 lb. can

SH O R TEN IN G _____ 59c
Northern

T IS S U E _____ 4 rolls 35c
Reg. $1.25, 13 oz.

Aqua Net Spray.  88c plus tax
Cashmere Bouquet 6V2 oz., reg. 59c

TALCUM . 49c plus tax

FROZEN FOODS
Shurfrost 8 oz.

Meat Pot Pie .  _ .  6-$l .00
Banquet 14 oz.

Cream Pie _ _ _ _ 4—$1.00
Shurfine 6 oz.

Orange Juice _ _ _ 4—$1.00

Neuhoff 3 lb.

MEATS
Canned H am ___ $2.39

Dandy Beef Steak lb. 49c 

Lone Star Bacon lb. 49c

No. 1 Russet

PRODUCE
set

Spuds .  .  10 lb. bag 69c
#

Lettuce--------head 13c

Carrots___cello bag 1 Oc

[afFIUMED)

Phone 759-4434

HOFBAUER’S
FOOD & LOCKER SERVICE
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