
The Eagle, mascot of the NTSU Mean Green athletic 
teams, was here for the Christmas parade. A Mean Green 
van, in which the Eagle came to town, also took a place in 
the parade. Staff Photo 

Morton Museum's WW II display 
features Robert Weinzapfel 
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When a federal judge in 
Arkansas decided a few 
weeks ago that students 
should have the opportunity 
to hear the other side of the 
dispute on the origin of 
man, people cheered. After 
all, it seemed like academic 
freedom in action. If there is 
a doubt about the correc-
tness of a theory, it seems 
only fair to present both 
viewpoints and allow a per-
son to decide which is more 
reasonable. 

That's the attitude which 
prevailed back in the twen-
ties when the Darwinian 
theory of man's origin 
challenged the Creation 
theory, which had been 
generally accepted before. 
In the interest of academic 
fairness, it was decided to 
make both theories 
available. 

That was about the time 
when Humanism was getting 
its start. The sophisticated 
intelligentia were em-
phasizing ideas of man's 
greatness, along with a ten-
dency to drift away from 
traditional belief in God. In 
this intellectual environment 
the Darwinian theroy 
became the favored theory. 
And after a while it became 
the only theory. The 
creation theory was forced 
out of the curriculum after 
years in which the Darwin 
claims evolved from theory 
to dogma. 

So, it was somewhat sho-
cking to the humanists a 
short time ago when the 
judge suggested offering 
both ideas to students. they 
had spent so many years 
presenting evolution as the 
established scientific fact 
that they believed it them-
selves. They thought it was 
scientific heresy to go back 
to the original idea of man's 
origin. The American Civil 
Liberties Union (ACLU), an 
organization which has long 
been at odds with patriotism 
and morality and religion, 
came out swinging in defen-
se of the ape theory. It was 
determined to prove that 
Genesis is not scientific, and 
any theory based on it has to 
be faulty. 

Before accepting ACLU's 
dogmatic repudiation of the 
bible, a person should try to 
understand that it can be 
just what millions of people 
think it is...the inspired 
word of God, and therefore 
the true story of creation. 
Authored by God, the book 
is scientifically correct as 
well as historically, morally 
and otherwise. So, it's likely 
as well as possible that 
Genesis is correct in spite of 
the humanist objections. 

In fact, when one judges 
on the basis of scientific 
validity, the creation theory 
seems more acceptable. A 
scientific axiom states that 
every effect must have a 
cause. Applying this to 
Darwinism, we encounter a 
major problem in trying to 
explain man's intelligence. 
The ape does not have the 
ability to think. The best it 
can do is repeat acts it was 
taught to do. It can't tran-
sfer to a descendant a 
faculty it does not have. 

And transfer of physical 
traits is no more scientific. 
There are many human 
characteristics that can't be 
convincingly explained as 
coming from an ape. They 
try to explain this problem 
by claiming that the process 
of evolution spread over 
millions of years, which of 
course is only a theory and 
can't be supported scien-
tifically. 

Besides, if evolution ac-
tually took place it ought to 
be still going on. But no one 
has yet shown any of the in-
between specimens between 
ape and man. Do they want 
us to believe evolution was a 
one time happening without 
any tangible evidence or 
cause-and-effect relation-
ship? Really, it seems absurd 
to claim that such reasoning 
is 	actually 	swc ieenn- 
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denying the validity of the 
other theory. 

Humanism's basic problem 
in this controversy is its 
continued on page 2... 

Changes in cable TV at 
Muenster were proposed last 
week by Alvin Fuhrman in 
an appearance before the 
city council. He said the 
suggestion is to increase the 
number of available chan-
nels from 12 to as many as 
21 plus two tiers of premium 
television. The proposal also 
includes price increases. 

Proposals call for no 
change in channels 2 
through 6; a change of 
channel 7 to carry a super 
independent 	station, 
probably from 	Atlanta 
(WBTS); a change of chan-
nel 10 to carry cable news 
network, a 24 hour a day 
news program; and no 
change in other channels 8 
to 13. The popular church 
services from Sacred Heart 
and First Baptist will con-
tinue. 

Fuhrman said the 12 
channel cable system 
originated in 1967 with 50 
subscribers and has grown 
to 512. The last rate in- 

On Monday December 7, 
1981, the fortieth anniver-
sary of the Japanese attack 
on Pearl Harbor, the Cooke 
County Heritage Society 
opened the Morton 
Museum doors for a a 
preview reception of the new 
exhibit "Bringing the Con-
flict Home: Cooke County 
in World War II." About 70 

Dr. Gregory Jackson, 
Denton pediatrician, recen-
tly presented a lecture to 
nurses and medical staff of 
Muenster Memorial 
Hospital on Jaundice in the 
Newborn. His talk covered 
causes, signs, symptoms and 
treatment and also reviewed 

Funeral service for Mrs. 
Nettie Mae Scoggins, 86, of 
Myra was held Monday at 2 
p.m. in the chapel of Vernie 
Keel Funeral Home with 
Dr. Harry Roark, retired 
Baptist minister, officiating. 

Burial was in the Reed 
Cemetery directed by the 
Keel Funeral Home, and the 
pallbearers were Bobby 
Scoggins, Stephen Rogers, 
Dwight Rogers, Douglas 
Rogers, Benton Rogers, 
gary Barrier, Ed Muse and 
Keith Burch. 

Mrs. 	Scoggins 	died 

Good News 
Hebrews 1:5-6 

For God never said to any 
of his angels, "Your are my 
Son; today I have become 
your Father." 

Nor did God say about 
any angel, "I will be his 
Father, and he will be my 
Son." 

But when God was about 
to send his first-born Son in-
to the world, he said, "All 
of God's angels must wor-
ship him."  

crease, to 86.00 per month 
was in 1976. Because of in-
flation since then a rate in-
crease to $8.00 is proposed 
for the basic service. Also 
offered for additional pay is 
satellite TV as a part of the 
basic service. 

More additional services 
at extra pay are two tiers of 
premium TV,. one to carry 
P and PG movies, the other 
having Showtime or Home 
Box Office programs. 
Present services with 
proposed changes on chan-
nels 7 and 10 and addition of 
the earth station would 
probably increase the price 
to $9.95 a month. The two 
premium tiers would cost an 
additional $9.95 each, a 
total cost of near S30 for the 
complete service. 

A survey blank on the 
proposals will be included 
with telephone bills. In-
terested persons are asked to 
fill out the forms and return 
them to the telephone com-
pany. 

persons were on hand to 
view the new exhibit. 

Robert John Weinzapfel, 
the first Cooke Countian 
killed in World Was 11 is 
featured in the exhibit. 
Memorabilia of Robert 
Weinzapfel, including a 
photograph, a gold star flag, 
a saber, and a certificate are 
Continued on page 3 

the Bili-light which was 
recently purchased by the 
hospital on recommendation 
of the Upper Trinity 
Perinatal Association. 

Jaundice is a common and 
usually harmless condition 
in newborn infants. The 
word "jaundice" comes 

Friday, two days after being 
admitted to Muenster 
Memorial Hospital with 
heart failure. Until this 
illness she was up daily en-
joying normal health in her 
home at Myra. 

She was born on Feb. 9, 
1895 in St. Joseph, Mich., a 
daughter of the late Mr. and 
Mrs. Harry B. Webster. She 
remembered coming to 
Arkansas in a covered 
wagon with her family when 
she was 4 years old. The 
family moved to Texas in 
1918. She was married on 
January 24, 1922, in 
Breckenridge to Walter 
Scoggins, who preceded her 
in death on January 6, 1975. 
The couple moved here in 
1949 from Vernon. 

Survivors are one son, 
Harry Scoggins of Muen-
ster; three daughters, Mrs. 
Juanita Rogers of Pampa, 
Mrs. Gavell Barrier of 
Wichita Falls, and Yvonne 
Hanza of Hobart, Okla.; 
one sister, Mrs. Mildred 
Choulder of Burbank, 
Calif.; 11 grandchildren and 
14 great-grandchildren. 

	

Muenster's 	annual 
Christmas parade and Santa 
Claus visit was delightful in 
spite of dreary, damp 
weather and conflicting 
schedules. A number of en-
tries failed to show because 
of the chill and involvement 
in school activities, 
especially basketball tour-
naments. 

Of those who came, three 
out-of-town entries were the 
favorites and received the 
prizes. Callisburg Bluejays 
were first place winners 
receiving the Chamber of 

The Department of Public 
Safety has estimated that as 
many as 89 persons may 
perish on Texas streets and 
highways during the 
Christmas and New Year's 
holidays. 

Colonel Jim Adams, DPS 
director, asked Texas drivers 
to make this holiday season 
the safest in recent years. 

"Nothing would please us 
more than to get through 
these holidays with far fewer 
fatalities than we project," 
Adams said. "We can 
reduce the number of 
fatalities if more drivers will 

from the French word 
meaning yellow. It describes 
the yellowish appearance of 
the whites of the eyes and 
the skin of many newborn 
babies. 

Physiologic or normal 
jaundice usually appears on 
the second or third day of 
life in healthy babies after a 
full-length pregnancy. It of-
ten appears within a week. 
Doctors estimate that as 
many as two thirds of full 
term babies get physiologic 
jaundice. 

Premature babies are even 
more likely to get jaundice. 
It may appear later and last 
longer in these infants, 
becoming most noticeable 
between the fourth and 
seventh days of life. 

A solution appears to be 
in sight for the city's fouled 
up paving job. Speaking for 
the contractor, Luke Con-
struction Co. of Gainesville, 
Butch Luke told city of-
ficials Monday that his firm 
is willing to pay up to $500 

for removal of defective 
crushed rock and dust from 
the streets and spread a 
replacement layer of harder 
rock when warm weather 
returns next year and softens 

the asphalt. Luke met with 
Councilmen Ronnie 
Felderhoff and David Fette 
at the city hall. 

He said that Muenster's 
trouble was caused by two 

Commerce $100 check. Cub 
Scout Pack 652 of 
Gainesville was next and 
received the $75 check; and 
Cub Scout Pack 663, also of 
Gainesville, received the S50 
check. Two other floats, the 
Muenster Cub Scouts and 
Fischer's Store were 
recognized as honorable 
mentions. 

The parade formed on 
Mesquite Street near High-
way 82 and proceeded on the 
highway to Main and con-
tinued to Fourth Street. It 
was headed by the VFW 

moderate 	their 	speed, 
refrain from using alcohol 
or drugs if they plan to drive 
and make sure everyone in 
the vehicle wears a seat 
belt." 

The DPS estimated that 
51 persons would die in 
motor vehicle accidents 
during the Christmas 
holiday weekend and 
another 38 people would be 
killed during the New Year 
holiday weekend. Both 
holiday periods are 78 hours 
long. 

Adams said 64 persons 
died in traffic crashes during 

In 	most 	instances 
physiologic jaundice is so 
mild that it can be ignored. 
It will disappear without 
treatment. However if the 
condition is more severe, or 
if the jaundice is present at 
birth or appears during the 
first 24 hours of life, treat-
ment probably will be 
necessary. 

In most babies jaundice 
occurs because the liver is 
not yet fully mature, and is 
unable to adequately rid the 
blood of the yellowish sub-
stance called bilirubin. It 
then builds up in the baby's 
blood stream causing the 
skin , rid the whites of the 
eyes to become yellow. This 
is particularly true of very 

Continued on page 3... 

factors: 	Warm 	paving 
weather did not last long 
enough for traffic to blend 
rock into the asphalt, and 
the crushed rock was not the 
correct grade for the job. 
Traffic ground it into dust. 
The city tried to remove sur-
plus rock and dust but 
found that its equipment 
could not handle the job. An 
inquiry led to a report that a 
Dallas firm does that kind of 
work. 

Luke said his company 
will agree to pay up to $500 
for removing the unwanted 
rock and dust. And it will 
spread a course of the 
correct grade of rock as 
soon as the weather is right.  

honor guard with Mayor 
and Mrs. Leo Hess along 
with Chamber of Commerce 
President and Mrs. Dick 
Ferber following on the 
original truck of the Muen-
ster Telephone Co. Next was 
the Muenster High Hornet 
Marching Band and the 
floats along with a number 
of decorated vehicles, a 
Mean Green van and eagle 
from NTSU, and a pair of 
mules from Plumlee's 
Mammoth Jacks. 

To children the most im-
portant part of the event was 

the 	Christmas 	holiday 
period last year. Motor 
vehicle accidents claimed 58 
lives over the New Year's 
holiday weekend. 

\During the first nine mon-
ths of this year, 151,261 per-
sons received injuries in 
Texas traffic accidents. 

"That's an increase of 
slightly over 10 percent 
compared to the same 
period in 1980," Adams 
said. "More than 19,000 of 
those people received 
serious, incapacitating in-
juries." 

Funeral service for Louis 
M. (Lou) Wolf, 79, a native 
and long time resident of 
Muenster, was held Wed-
nesday, Dec. 16, at 9 a.m. in 
Sacred Heart Church with 
Father Stephen Eckart of-
ficiating at the Mass of 
Christian Burial. 

"Lou was a man who kept 
the faith in spite of great ad-
versity," Father Stephen 
said. During his long 
physical affliction he kept 
faith in himself, not being 
overcome by self pity or self 
doubt. He kept faith with 
others, appreciating family 
and friends and not resen-
ting his dependency. And he 
kept faith in God, accepting 
illness without bitterness in 
his belief that God does 
what is best. 

Others participating in the 
service were the Sacred 
Heart Choral Group, Bart 
Wolf and Stephen Ham-
mond in the scripture 
readings, and Stephen  

the coming of Santa Claus 
on the city's big fire truck. 
When the parade completed 
its route he met with the lit-
tle ones at the community 
Christmas tree on the AMPI 
corner for individual visits 
and presenting packages of 
an orange and candy which 
had been provided jointly by 
the Jaycees and the Cham-
ber of Commerce. 

While that was going on 
the Cub Scouts had a similar 
get-together with Mrs. Santa 
in the VFW Hall. Each 
meeting lasted more than an 
hour. 

A special attraction was a 
group of carolers directed by 
Principal Stephen Beyer. 
They were at the Hess Fur-
niture corner, entertaining 
while spectators were 
awaiting arrival of the 
parade. 

The parade completed the 
city's pre-Christmas ac-
tivities. Yule lighting along 
the highway and Main Street 
were installed shortly after 
Thanksgiving, the com-
munity tree was procured 
near Red River and 
decorated by a Jaycee work 
'n play party, and the 
"Noel" display plus five 
strings of lights at the water 
tower were activated a few 
days before the parade. 

Hammond and Dale Wolf in 
the offertory presentations. 

Burial was in Sacred 
Heart cemetery directed by 
Nick Miller Funeral Home. 
Pallbearers were Bart Wolf, 
Stephen Hammond, Mike 
Barron, Scott Wolf, Dale 
Wolf and Stuart Wolf. 

Earlier services were 
recitation of the rosary at 4 
and 8 p.m. Tuesday in the 
chapel of Miller Funeral 
Home. 

Lou Wolf died at 10:15 
a.m. Sunday in Muenster 
Memorial Hospital ending a 
long illness. His final 
hospitalization lasted about 
one month. 

He was born Nov. 2, 1902 
in Muenster, a son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry M. Wolf, 
pioneer residents of the 
community. He was married 
to Regina Schoech on April 
21, 1932. 

Lou was a barber for 53 
years, working at the trade 
for 6 years before going into 
business for himself in 
Muenster in 1927. He con-
tinued the business until he 
suffered a stroke in 1974. He 
was a 37 year member of the 
Muenster Knights of 
Columbus Council. 

Survivors are his wife, 
Regina; two sons, Mitchel of 
Houston and Roger of 
Clearwater, Fla.; two 
daughters, Lou Rena Ham-
mond of New York City and 
Charlotte Barron of Win-
der, Ga.; 9 grandchildren; 
four brothers, Ed of Whit-
ney and Henry, Bernard and 
Charlie of Muenster; and 
one sister, Gertrude Sims of 
Muenster. 

Carolers add to the Christmas spirit while specta-
tors await arrival of the Christmas parade. The group 

was accompanied by Principal Stephen Beyer on a gui- 
tar. 	 Staff Photo 

Santa comes with Yule parade 

Nettie Scoggins, 86, dies 

Paving solution proposed 

DPS expects 89 deaths 

Jaundice in newborns discussed 
	

Service held for Lou Wolf 
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Instructions from the... 

wners Manual 

COMMENT 
by 	Dr. George S. Benson 	President 

Looking Ahead NATIONAL EDUCATION PROGRAM 

Searcy, Arkansas 

tv, Stark h merson 

Man's 14K gold Mexican 
coin ring with 2Y,peso. 

Is our society today 
hijacking authority and for-
cing it to meet its demands? 
We have become ac-
customed to seeing ourselves 
and others come into 
horrifying situations 
because we can't or won't 
accept those in authority as 
persons placed there by God 
for several purposes. Those 
purposes are what need to be 
exposed in the light of scrip-
ture. 

Before we expose one of 
the three reasons for 
authority we must come to 
grips with what we're doing 
when we resist authority. 
Romans 13:2 tells us, "so 
anyone who resists authority 
is rebelling aginst God's 
decision and such an act is 
bound to be punished." 

Our Lord Himself at the 
age of twelve had to deal 
with one purpose of 
authority that none of us 
really learn to deal with. He 

"I receive an 
excellertt yield and 
these exclusive 
features:" 

r 
was given the opportuaity to 
start his ministry at a very 
early age and "he busy with 
my Father's affairs." 
Should he follow his 
spiritual calling or should he 
submit to his parents? Jesus 
didn't rebel but "He then 
went down with them and 
came to Nazareth and lived 
under their authority. And 
Jesus increased in wisdom 
and in stature and in favor 
with God and man." And 
thus is one of the purposes 
of authority. Whether or not 
we have parents like Jesus or 
a boss or teacher that is sain-
tly or not, we should have 
the faith to believe that God 
has placed certain persons in 
authority over us to develop 
a character and wisdom in 
us. We can run from some 
things but from this we can 
never escape. If we dodge 
the hammer of authority we 
only move into a position of 
having to deal with it at 
some later time in life. 

Confetti... 
denial of God, which in it-
self is completely unscien-
tific. Admitting that we 
can't by-pass the cause and 
effect axiom, we have to be 
aware of a Creator to whom 
every object, every living 
thing and every intelligence 
must eventually be traced. 
He possessed the infinite 
power and wisdom to make 
everything. We know this 
from both faith and science. 

As regards the origin of 
man, faith and science tell us 
that it has to be a creation by 
God. The other explanation 
simply does not stand up. It 
could have happened as told 
in Genesis, because God cer-
tainly had the power to do 
it. 

On the other hand God also 
had the power to use the 
evolutionary process. It's 

55 ASIIIMI ION. 1/.( . 

—Reports that Me Administra-
tion is now down-playing the 

role of federal spending 

deficits on inflation and in-
terest rates are more than 

disappointing and arc sieves 
not shared by the vast majority 

of conservative Democrats in 
Washington. 

At this writing, the Presi-
dent himself has not com-

mented on this latest turn by 
members of his Council of 

Economic Advisers, who told 
members of the press this week 

that - During a time of reces-
sion, such as the present, a 

large deficit won't be crowding 
out the rather modest funding 

needs of business and con-
sumers." 

According to press reports. 
the Administration has decided 

to abandon its goal of a 
balanced budget in fiscal 1984, 

rather than to back assay from 

its tax cuts or its support of an 
anti-inflationery monetary 

policy by the Federal Reserve 
Board. 

I have to argue, loudly and 

clearly, against the notion that 
deficit spending is inevitable 

and that, according to William 
A. Niskanen, one of the Presi-

dent's economic advisers, 
"There is no direct or indirect 

connection between deficits 
and inflation." 

The federal debt has just 
passed the SI trillion mark. 

That is a figure that most of as 
have no concept of, but if you 

stacked I trillion one-dollar 
bills, the pile would reach 63 

miles into the sky. And the in-

terest on that debt is around 

SI 10 billion annually. The 
money to pay that interest is 
taken out of capital markets 

continued from page 1... 

conceivable that physical 
creation could have been 
achieved by gradual 
development, but there had 
to be a separate Divine in-
tervention at the stage where 
the lower animal became a 
man. 

To be more correct, the 
matter of man's origin can 
be explained only as a 
creation. The only problem 
is what method God used. 
And that doesn't matter a 
greed deal. The fact that 
counts is that we came from 
God and people who deny it 
are fumbling in the dark. 

LrItsr Carr Sep . 

DRIVE AND ARRIVE 
SAFELY 

TELLS InolwAT t9all of 

and could have been used to 

build millions of homes: 

bought new machinery for our 
factories which in turn would 

make possible the employment 
of more workers and make this 

country competitive with in-
dustralized countries like 

Japan. 
That habit of government 

borrowing against itself — at 

whatever interest rate prevails 
at the time — puts pressure on 

money supplies that currently 
make it next to impossible for 

young couples to buy their own 
home and, indeed, housing 
starts this year will be the 

lowest in 35 years. 
Prime interest rates have 

dropped from a high of 21.5 
percent in January to around 

16.5 percent by the end of 

November. Other economic in-
dicators are beginning to show 
some gradual improvement, 

particularly in increased 
savings deposits. These in-
creases in savings, including 

money market mutual fund 
shares, saving deposits and 

small denomination time 

deposits, are the result of tax 
incentives for individuals pass-

ed by Congress this summer. 
Tax cuts and incentives that af-

fect business will go into effect 
the first of the year and must 

be gis en a chance to work. 
I remain committed to the 

general approach we have 

taken this year to get federal 
spending under control and 
balance the federal budget. If 

the President's advisers are 
telling him that there "is no 
direct or indirect connection 

between deficits and 
inflation," then I have to 

seriously question the advice he 
is getting. 

TIIE POWELL 
MEMORANDUM — 

PART I 
Few individuals in America 

are as important as those ap-
pointed to the United Stales 
Supreme Court. Their decisions 
affect all of as every day of our 
lives. For this reason their 
philosophy is vital. 

It is especially important that 
Supreme Court Justices be 
staunch supporters of the 
private enterprise system, 
because all that we cherish as 
"the American way of life" is 
made possible by our economic 
system_ 

In 1971, some two months 
before he was appointed to the 
Supreme Court. Virginia 
lawyer Lewis F. Powell, Jr., 
was asked by a friend to 
prepare a memorandum 
analyzing the threat to free 
enterprise and what could be 
done about it 

Although the memorandum 
was written for the use of the 
United States Chamber of 
Commerce some ten years ago, 
its message is as timely and 
vital as if it were drafted today. 

The basic message of the 
Powell paper is that the free 
enterprise system and the great 
business system it has spawned 
"are in deep trouble, and the 
hour is late." 

The trouble is caused by a 
broadly based, consistent at-
tack by those who oppose 
private enterprise, those who 
believe in some form of 
collectivism, such as Com-
munism, Fascism or so-called 
'democratic socialism." 
The fountainhead of the at-

tack on economic freedom is the 

college campus, and the focal 
point will be found in the social 
science departments' 
economics, political science, 
history, and especially 
sociology These are the areas 
where theoreticians hold sway. 

where the dreamers plan and 
promote their "Utopias." And 
from these sources arise the 
legislation which hampers 
businessmen in the efficient 
operation of their firms. This is 
where the Naders and 
Clayhrooks are spawned and 
where their "troops" are 
trained. 

A few individuals, including 
your commentator, long ago 
recognized the sources and 
nature of this assault on our 
fundamental principles and 
institutions. And a few business 
leaders have had the wisdom to 
see the danger and have given 
their support to educational 
endeavors such as our National 
Education Program. 

But unfortunately, as Justice 
Powell notes, "The painfully 
sad truth is that business, in-
cluding the boards of directors 
and the top executives of cor-
porations great and small and 
business organizations at all 
levels, often have responded —
if at all — by appeasement, 
ineptitude and ignoring the 
problem." 

With interest rates near 20 
percent, stagnating the 
housing, automobile and 
associated industries, with the 
stock market sometimes losing 
billions of dollars in a day. 
businessmen should be getting 
the message that it's time to 
"fight or die." 

In the absence of any 
governmental agency with the 
responsibility of maintaining 

"An Edward D. Jones 
Co. Self-Directed 

IRA is my passport to 
retirement." 

• Flexibility of investments — select from 
government bonds, corporate bonds, and high 
grade common stocks. 

• Tex deductible contributions — up to 82.000 
beginning January 1. 1982, )S1.500 for the 1981 
tax year). 

• Tax deferred compounding Interest and capital 
gains — select high yielding taxable investments 
and defer that income until retirement when your 
tax bracket may be considerably lower. 

To learn more about now a Sell-Directed IRA Plan can 

provide for your retirement, contact 

Expanded Hours: 

Our Gainesville Office will he 

open longer between non and December 31. 

• Saturdays: 9 A.M. to Noon 
• Monday Evenings until 8:00 P.M. 
• Wednesday Evenings until 8:00 P.M. 

KEN FLOYD 

First State Bank Bldg. 

Sulfa 301,  811 -665.0351 	Gainesville. Tx. 76240 

VW Edward 
O. Jones 
& Co. 

15.0%* 

KEN FLOYD 

'650" 

St. Christopher anchor 
in 14K gold on 18" chain 

Open Mon. - Sat. 

JEWELRY FOR HER 
'850°° 
Diamonds & Gems 

'270" A a214 

Pesco 

Coin 
is set in a twisted 
rope edge mounting sus 
oended human 113• 
rope chain 

Heart Ring starting at 

With Diamond 17" 
Heart Pendant 
With Diamond 

Starting at 

'109" 

system, 
sm. s uItp fp:trist nt otuher sehcoouniodme rsi c 

of every businessman, as the 
leaders of the system, to rise to 
the challenge and accept that 
responsibility. 

It's survival time! Powell 
said. "The day is long past 
when the chief executive officer 
of a major corporation 
discharges his responsibility by 
maintaining a satisfactory 
growth of profits. If our 
system is to survive, top 
management must be equally 
concerned with protecting and 
preserving the system itself 
. . 

Large businesses should 
designate full-time employees 
to counter the attack on the 
enterprise system. small firms 
can support programs which 
are involved in the struggle. But 
every business should enlist in 
the struggle! 

11111 111111111111 

GEO. J. 

Carroll 
not1111(41-11 s111.11 

In All 
The World 

No one is more 
understanding or 
more qualified 
to serve you. 

Stud Jackets 

Starting from '22°° 

Diamond Bracelet 
smd--J Ti'. tPustration _ 

Starting at 
$6400 

Sl 

0 
U 

C) 

U 

A Free Gift to each customer who comes in the store 

	  a. Bring This Coupon In For This Special Offer 

JEWELRY FOR HIM 

Free with SSO purchase while they last 

Grape Salt 6 Pepper Set lemon ressstant two 
Shakers are S -  rn height, grape colorel Glh Boxed 

viol Reg. 522.00 Note (0 ,  I 	■ 

GIFTS. FROM THE HEART   

All Nurses 
Watches 

25% et 

and also til S p.m. every Thursday 

"Serving the Gainesville Area for over 25 years" 

Sartaleri ewely 
West side of Courthouse 	105 S. Commerce. Gainesville. 665-2242 2 102 



IGRkg 

;
ceders ""u  ,ders 

the 
— "ise to eept that  

Pftell 
Ong past 
.;:o,rafrt. 

sihilily 
b is taclor; 

n;e" ourt op 

cling antl i tseu  

sho u ld 

'k on the 
 all firms 
 ns which 

 iggle. But 
I enlist in 

ar  

IS O N  
Ire 

is 

id] '22 °' 

id Bra° 
dusdio- 

lit 

•sdaY 

1242 

iC
IIM

M
E

M
ill
 

El
leZ

EI
DM

E:
Ei

De
l 

. 	 • 	 • 

NICK OF TIME 

SALE 
Cu 

ug.t 

The JCPenney Comfort Suit. 	 Cu  

At a very comfortable price. 

Sale 55.99 
Rag. $75. Sit. Stoop. Bend. And do it in comfort. The JCPenney 
Comfort Suit in a new stretch fabric of today's 100% Dacrone 
polyester from Klopman Textured Wovens. Regular, and long 
sizes. 
If purchased separately: Slacks. Reg. $20 Sale 13.99 
Jacket, Reg. $55 Sale $42 Cu  

20% off 
Save on robes 
and sleepwear. 

Sale 4.80 to 22.40 Reg. $6 to $28. 
You'll be sleeping pretty in our 
beautiful dreamers. Mini peignoir 
set or toga style baby dolls of silky-
smooth nylor. Sitting cozy in our 
full length robes. Wrap or zip front 
styles. With classic details like 
smocking. trapunto trim and more.  
Warming you in fleeced poly. 
acetate/nylon. Sizes XS.S.M.L.  

Sale prices effective through Selurcley. 

Open 9 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

Gainesville Shopping Center 

1JCPenneyj  
THE CHRISTVAS PACE 

EXKIMIZIOIEMOCIEIMICIVICIEMENIMEIE100110211 

This float entered by the Callisburg Bluejays was first 
place winner in last Saturday's Christmas parade spon-
sored by the Muenster Chamber of Commerce. The 

prize was a $100 check. Winners of second and third 
places were Cub Scout packs of Gainesville, Numbers 
652 and 663. 	 Staff Photo 

monmermirtm 
NOTICE! 

—4. 
v\I;ft/I4S 

Thurs. A 	 - 

thru Dec. 24 Only $3°° 
THE MUSIQUE SHOPPE 

105 North Dixon 665-0391 

"Pictures 
with Santa" 

Happy 94th Birthday 

To Uncle Willie Jander 
in Benton, Arkansas 

Ch.4, 

E.,ky , mM y .&A 	:5... y  

Guess Who's 40?? 

_nappy 

eirt4day! 

Monica 

600 Texans mail responses 

national conservation survey 
Nearly 600 people in 

Texas have mailed their 
responses on the proposed 
national soil and water con-
servation program outlined 
by the Secretary of 
Agriculture, reports George 
C. Marks, state conser-
vationist for the USDA Soil 
Conservation Service (SCS) 
in Temple. 

When the review period 
ends on January 15, the 
responses will be sum-
marized and a report 
prepared for the Secretary. 

SCS has been designated 
to collect the comments in 
Texas. The mailing address 
is P.O. Box 648, Temple, 
Texas 76503. 

Marks said he was pleased 
with the number of respon-
ses received so far but added 
that he expects and 
welcomes more before the 
January 15 cutoff date. 
During a review of earlier 
drafts, more than 3,700 

Joan Walterscheid 
Joan Walterscheid, RN, 

director of nurses at Muen-
ster Memorial Hospital, was 
recently elected president of 
the Directors of Nurses for 
Small Hospitals, an 
organization of which she 
has been a member for two 
years. 

Monthly meetings are 
held in Wichita Falls, which 
is centrally located for 
members representing 14 
hospitals of the area. Mon-
thly programs include topics 

* * * * 
Deadline for placing 
names in the Hospital 
Auxiliary's special 
project, "In Lieu of 
Christmas Cards" is 
Friday December 18. 
Persons wishing to be 
included are reminded 
of the short time left 
for inclusion. Names 
and donations may be 
sent or given to Mrs. 
Ted Henscheid at Tops 
and Teams, Box 358 or 
phone 759.2540. 

* * * * 

Jaundice... 
continued from page I... 

small or pre-mature babies. 
When a baby's jaundice 

does require treatment, a 
technique 	 called 
phototherapy is 	usually 
used. Phototherapy simply 
means treatment using light. 
Light-either sunlight or ar-
tificial light- speeds up the 
removal of bilirubin from 
the body. 

In 	phototherapy 	the 
baby's skin is exposed to 
spinal high intensity lights, 
often called "bililights." 
Phototherapy continues un-
til the amount of bilirubin in 
the baby's blood reaches 
and remains at a normal or 
near normal level. 

Joan Walterscheid, R.N. 
director of nurses, stated 
"We at Muenster Memorial 
are happy to be able to 
provide this service, and are 
constantly striving to im-
prove our service to our 
patients and our com-
munity." 

No garbage pick-up 
The City of Muenster an-

nounces that trash and gar-
bage service will not be 
available on Christmas and 
New Year. The purpose is to 
give city workers time off 
for the holidays. However, 
the truck will make its usual 
route on the Thursdays 
preceding the holidays.  

people in Texas made writ-
ten responses. 

The main features of the 
proposed national conser-
vation program are in-
creased roles for local and 
state governments in conser-
vation work and targeting a 
greater portion of USDA 
dollars and staff to critical 
soil and water resource 
problem areas. 

The program is the USDA 
response to the Soil and 
Water Resources Conser-
vation Act of 1977 (RCA). 
SCS and Agricultural 
Stabilization and Conser-
vation Service offices 
throughout the state have a 
supply of a leaflet that 
summarizes the program 
containing a pre-addressed, 
postage-paid response form. 

The offices also have a 
reference copy of the full 
report of the program and 
draft environmental impact 
statement. 

heads nurse group 
presented by guest speakers, 
exchange of ideas and 
procedures and discussion 
of subjects relative to all 
directors of nurses. 

Morton Museum... 
Continued from page I 

on loan for this exhibit. The 
certificate reads: "In 
grateful memory of Robert 
John Weinzapfel who died 
in the service of his country 
at sea, Pacific Area, at-
tached Scouting Squadron 
Two, 9 December 1941. He 
stands in the unbroken line 
of patriots who have dared 
to die that freedom might 
live, and grow, and increase 
its blessings. Freedom lives, 
and through it, he lives - in a 
way that humbles the under-
takings of most men. 
(signed) Franklin D. 
Roosevelt, President of the 
United States of America. 

Mr. J.M. Weinzapfel, 
father, Mrs. Juanita Bright, 
sister, and Mrs. Victoria 
Gremminger, aunt of Robert 
Weinzapfel visited the 
museum for the preview 
reception. 

The exhibit can be viewed 
at the Morton Mueseum of 
Cooke County, 210 S. 
Dixon, Gainesville, Tuesday 
through Saturday from 
12:00 to 5:00 p.m. and Sun-
day from 2:00 to 5:00 p.m. 

For more information 
contact Ronnie Roese, 668-
8900 . 

Santa is coming to 
St. Richard's Villa, Inc. 

on December 23, 6:30 p.m. 

Friends & relatives are invited 



Mr and Mrs. Arnold Knabe have announced the 
engagement and approaching marriage of their daughter, 
Carol, to Johnny Hilton, son of Mr. and Mrs. James N. 
Hilton of Marietta, Okla. The couple has selected Satur-
day January 2 for their wedding day in Sacred Heart 
Church. 

The bride-elect is a graduate of Sacred Heart High 
School and is employed as a dispatcher at Reliable Power 
Tongs, Inc. The future groom is a graduate of Marietta 
High School and is also an employee of Reliable Power 
Tongs, Inc. 

It's Later Than You Think! 
Only 6 more shopping days left 

Last Minute Specials at 

he Hu 	in 
Muenster 

Children's Pile Slippers 

Thermal 
Children's Underwear 

 

500 pair  

8 °°  set 

1/2 
 price 

1/2 
 price 

 

Jr. Jogging Suits 

Jr. & Pre-Teen tops. 
dresses, skirts. etc. 

  

  

       

We will close at Noon Dec. 24 

P.S. 2 Preteen Rabbit Coats 

Reg 891.50 g510 
Only 	each 

New Hours 
at 

Muenster Garden Center 

EFFECTIVE 1st SATURDAY 
OF JANUARY 

8 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. Mon. - Fri. 
8 a.m. to 12 Noon, Saturday 

101 

4  

OFF OUR 
TAGGED PRICES 

BOON DOCK, INC. 
OUT FROM UNDER 4 FEET OF WATER WITH 

GREAT SAVINGS 
In New Merchandise • And Super Savings in Usable Flood Items 

20 °A) OFF 
OUR REGULAR ' 
LOW PRICE 

Wrangler and 

BLUE JEANS Other Brands 

FAlues to $22.95 Jr. & Misses 

Limit 1 Pair Per Customer 7 
95 

OUR PRICE 

GIFTS 

TOY FOOTBALLS 
Best Price we've seen $4.99 

OUR PRICE S  1 98  

TOOLS 
Screwdriver Sets, 

Wrenches, 

Socket Sets, Etc.  20% 

DO IT YOURSELF HEADQUARTERS 

1/4" 4'x8' HARDWOOD PLYWOOD 	$595 

4'x8' WALL PANELS 
8 15 Patterns, Wood, $12 95 Value OUR PRICE 

$00 
Sheet 

Clear and Sanded One Side, $12.95 Value OUR PRICE 

901 A 1-34 North, Gainesville, Texas 	 665.7443 

STEAK KNIVES 
Ecco Stainless, 

$16.95 Value 

$395 

• • KITCHEN & BATH 
CABINETS 

UP TO 60 0/0 OFF 

UPHOLSTERY FABRICS 
Naugahyde, 

Nylon $.100 

OUR SALE PRICE 	Yard  

PAINT Name Brands, 

Glidden, Dupont & Others 

UP TO 60 % OFF 

Pla 2 BIG BARGAIN TABLES 
FLOOD MERCHANDISE 

25 0  to $200 

OUR PRICE 

•dolly Good Gifts * 
FOR A JOYFUL CHRISTMAS' 

Thurs. Fri. & Sat. Only 

25% OFF 

All 
Merchandise 

in Stock 
Open till 8 pm on Thurs. 

The Jean Joint 
115 W. Calif ornia, Downtown Gainesville, 665-7971 
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New Arrivals 

/ 12" BRASS 

1
1 CRANES 

1 ail. NOW 18" 

:•• 	Reg 32.95 

1 

A go043 E7' graJJ 
 (Book Rack & Thimble) 
114 N. Commerce 

A ViS4. 
 

8 1 7 PF5 744, 
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3 TIER BRASS 
HANGING BASKETS 

Reg 5" 95 

NOW '3" 

WEEKLY 
• e •   

PLit 

EICIEMPKW9g 

SPECIAL 

SOLID BRASS LEOPARD 
Kee 51" 

NOW '8" 

Reg 934 95 

NOW 

'21" 

Wail sh 	" c?,. 
elves % 

Baskets 	eNe$ tez  
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Christmas joy was an-
nounced this week in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Jim-
my Kupper of Valley View, 
when Bryan Joseph became 
their little boy on December 
15, 1981, at the age of three 
months. He weighed 6 lb. 
31/2 oz. at birth on Septem-
ber 10 and today he weighs 
14 lb. Bryan Joseph is a 
brother for Daryl and 
Susan, and a grandson for 
Mrs. Marie Reiter and Mr. 
and Mrs. John Kupper. He 
is the 118th great-grandchild 
for Mrs. Elizabeth Neu. 
Mrs. Jimmy Kupper is the 
former Janell Reiter. 

--- 
Pat and Janice Endres 

announce the birth of their 
first child, a boy, Trent 
Patrick, on December 12, 
1981 at 7:54 a.m., weighing 
8 lb. 14 oz. His grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Leon 
Krebs of Gainesville and 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond En-
dres of Muenster. Great-
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Krebs, Sr. of 
Gainesville, Mrs. Millie 
Fleitman of Muenster and 
Mrs. Rosa Neu of Lindsay . 

Garden Club has H 
A fire crackling in the 

fireplace, a gaily lighted, 
ceiling-high tree, a blue-
draped wall accented with 
gold figures, all these con-
tributed to create an ex-
cellent setting for an original 
reading of the Christmas 
story by Peggie Western of 
Bowie. 

The Muenster Garden 
Club Christmas party Mon-
day evening in the home of 
Mrs. Loretta Felderhoff, 
was enchanted by the guest 
speaker and her inter-
pretation of the great Bible 
story. Mrs. Western is 
currently studying for her 
PhD degree at Texas 
Woman's University, and 
was a house guest of Mrs. 
Holly Koch. 

A short business meeting 
preceded the program by 
Mrs. Western. Included 
were announcements of 
committees to function for 
the March District meeting 

Community Lumber 

hosts party for 

customers, friends 
Community Lumber ex-

tended its season's greetings 
to about 325 customers and 
friends at a Christmas party 
at the Ranch. The night spot 
was exclusively reserved for 
the occasion and pick-up 
foods and drinks were 
catered by The Center. 

An added attraction was 
six drawings for door 
prizes, the lucky winners 
being Mattie Endres, Don 
Hartman, Arthur Bayer, 
Agnes Meurer, Kathy 
Sicking and Clyde Fisher. 

Mrs Dickie Pagel 
registered the guests. Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerome Pagel con-
ducted the drawing. 

Mr. and Mrs. Norman 
Snodgrass of Edinburg, 
Texas are parents of their 
first child, a son Robert 
Paul, born on Friday, 
December 11 at 2:21 p.m. at 
McAllen Methodist 
Hospital, weighing 8 lb. The 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Snodgrass of 
Edinburg, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jess Martin of Markham, 
Texas. Mrs. Martin is for-
merly of Gainesville. Mrs. 
Norman Snodgrass is the 
former Laverna Richardson, 
sister of Mrs. August Fleit-
man of Muenster. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 

Skinner of Gainesville are 
parents of their first child, a 
son, Lee Thomas, born in 
Gainesville Memorial 
Hospital on Friday, Decem-
ber 4, 1981 at 2:15 p.m., 
weighing 6 lb. 2 oz. The 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Ben Fleitman, Sr. of 
Muenster and Mrs. Mary 
Davis of Gainesville. The 
Fleitmans are counting a fif-
th grandchild born this year. 
Mrs. Tommy Skinner is the 
former Anna Marie Fleit-
man. 

oliday meeting 
in Gainesville. Alice Roark, 
president reminded that 
each member is expected to 
provide two items for a sales 
booth. A trip by members to 
visit Kaden The Florist was 
arranged for Wednesday. 

A gift plant exchange 
followed. The plants were 
grown earlier by members 
specifically anticipating the 
plant exchange. 

From a table decorated in 
red, the hostess, Mrs. 
Felderhoff served Christmas 
delicacies, candies, cookies, 
cake, spiced tea and punch 
to members and guests, Mrs. 
Westerm and Mrs. Vaudeen 
Rutledge, another guest of 
the Kochs. 

Rev. Harry Fisher will 
be director of 
European tour 

Father Harry Fisher an-
nounced this week that he 
will be the spiritual director 
for a grand tour of Catholic 
Europe in April and May, 
provided a sufficient num-
ber of persons will sign up 
for the trip. 

As scheduled on the tour 
brochure, the 17 day trip, 
April 19 to May 5, will begin 
with a flight by Irish Airlines 
from New York to Shannon 
Ireland. Among the many 
stops are Limerick, Dublin, 
Lourdes, Rome, Madrid, 
Lisbon and Fatima in-
cluding an audience with the 
Holy Father, and visits to 
famous shrines and places of 
special religious and 
historical significance. The 
all inclusive price from and 
to New York City is $2299. 

Information is available 
by contacting Father Harry 
Fisher at St. Thomas 
Aquinas Rectory, Pilot 
Point, Tx. 76258. 

Screen Dividers 

$7995 

SNAP Menus 

Tues. Dec. 22 - Beet 
Stroganoff w/noodles, 
green beans, pickled beets, 
tapioca pudding, homemade 
bread, hurter, milk, 

Dec. 22, 23, 24 
Wed. 	Dec. 	23 	- 

Cheeseburgers, with trim-
mings. French fries, ice 
cream, milk. 

Thurs. Dec. 24 - Stew, let-
tuce salad, peaches, bread, 
butter, milk 

Lifestyle 

BRENTWOOD 
HALL TREE 

VIKKI'S 

icker 

WEICIMPPEIF,1, PL9J2 

Special for 
Christmas 

tie '4Ik 
s'IN‘ 

asket 
665-8615 Mon. - Sat. 10-5 p.m . 

Gainesville 

wmpnin 

A! It!•' !tit.  " '  tlf414. . AL*. 



82's are 
HERE! 

• Double-wall construction 
• Rugged, girder beam front suspension on 

2-wheel drive models 
• Thermostatically operated fan clutch 
• Steel-belted radial tires 
• 2. and 4-wheel drive available 
• New design for the 80's 

WINTERIZE NOW! 
Let us be your Tune-up Headquarters 

HOEDEBECK GMC 
Muenster 759-4366 
	 MACH 

Library cookbooks for 

great Christmas gifts 
How about solving a less 

gift problems quickly by 
giving a "Cooking With 
Friends" Cookbook to 
special friends for Christmas 
this year? 

That's the holiday gift 

suggestion 	ottered 	by 
"Friends of the Library." 
The books are available at 
Muenster Public Library, 
same price as last year. 
Emily Klement is project 
chairman. 

TRUCKS ARE WHAT WE'RE ALL ABOUT 

Lisa is seven 
Lisa 	Dawn 	Russell's 

seventh birthday was Satur-
day, December 12. It was 
observed when her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bryan Russell 
entertained with party at 
their home. 

A Strawberry Shortcake 
theme was followed in the 
cake baked and decorated 
by her mother and served 
with punch, followed by 
opening of gifts, pictures 
and games. 

Guests 	included 	the 
honoree's great-
grandmother, Mrs. Victoria 
Gremminger, her little sister 
Amanda Russell, also Judy 
and Chris Pagel, Amy 
Sturm, Travis and Michelle 
Trachta, Diane Pagel, Lori 
Lee Klement, Scott Hen-
nigan, Joy Tisdale, Leslie 
Perkins, and Heather Blum. 

The honoree's father was 
unable to join the party 
because he was hospitalized 
with a broken clavicle. 

II IIIIIIIIIIIIIIII!IIIIIIIIIt 

Panasonic 

Portable Stereo 

• Auto end of tape shut off 
Cassette 	y 

.Ac - DC operation 
• ,ghtweight stereo 

• Durable ABS cabinet 
• Detachable strap 
• No K5000 

$30 4C 

ead0hOneS included 	7 	Reg 49 44 
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SEMI ANNUAL 

CLOARANCE 
Mens 
30% 
OFF 

,,,theirn 	Johns', 

Rand 	l,,aIos 

,. sale eludesdress 	;. 

od two 	few. stork , 

ier 400 pees is choose torn 

Womens 
20% to 50% 

OFF 

Entire Stock of Womens hoots 

ORM 

Childrens 
30%  to 50% 

OFF 

Over 600 pairs 

All Boots 

ENTIRE STOCK 	20% 
HOUSE SHOES 	Off 

ENTIRE STOCK 	3nOin  
u it.1 HANDBAGS 

OFF 

llivanz 	Phone 
Orders 

CC C ?Ye 
No!! 

Lay-a-ways 

107 W. California, 817-665-5861 Gainesville 
Please 

Downtown Gainesville 
/ 

Starts Thurs 
Dec. 17 

9:00 a.m. 

Share the Joy of having 
guests for Christmas, by 
telling your out-of-town 
relatives and friends about 
Christmas festivities. Call 
759-4311 or write Boy 190, 
Muenster, Texas 76252. 

CHRISTMAS is a drift fence 
across prairies of the past to 
keep friends from wan-
dering too far from our 

"Christmas is a drift fence" 
range. 
Douglas Meador, "Trail 
Dust" Lone Star gardener, 
Dec. 1970. 

5.46 lann •Wilen  Se,  for Les, • we Merl Sells for less • Wel Mart Sells for Less • Wel Mart Sells for Le s • IANANI•w Sells for Less • Wel Marl Sells for Less • Wel Met Sells ter Less • Wel-Werf Sells feel 

WAL-MART 
we Sell For Less EVERY DAY! 

Prices Good Through Sat. Dec.19 
1311 Grand Ave. Gainesville, Texas 

Open 9AM-10PM 
• 

Electronics Super Low 
Prices On 

Quality. Name 
Brand Sound 

Systems! 

• 

Save 5.00 

AM-FM Deluxe Electronic Digital 
Clock Radio by General Electric 
• Easy to read fluorescent time display 
• Audible and visual power failure indication 
• Easy time and alarm setting •Gontemporary styling 
• No 7-4666 •Reg. 37.94 

Save 3.00 
General Electric 
AMIFM Miniature 
Portable Radio 
• Conyencnt carry mong 
• Earphone included 

966 

VISA 

Reg. 12.66 

master charge 
WAL-MART'S ADVERTISED MERCHANDISE POLICY 
It is our !Menton to have every advertised item in stock, however, II due to any unforeseen reason, en advertised dem is not available 

for purchaSe, Wel-Mart will issue a Rain check on request tor the merchandise to be purched a rice whenevei 

wealable, Or will sell you a simllar item a1a comparable reduction in price We reserve the riphlIo as pun, 
 l 0,0 sale p 
 

(V)1310NE - 
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A. Save $51 

$733 
Reg 784 00 

15 Watt 1-1iFi Stereo System 
by Panasonic 
• 15 Watt amplifier AM/FM tuner with illuminated slide 

rule dial 
• Cassette Deck with power touch control 
• Full auto stop with Dolby noise reduction •Belt drive 
full auto turntable •2 Way thruster speakers 

• Rack with deluxe casters and glass doors 
• No P44 

44)\•A•4/4  

Save 50.00 

3494.88 
Reg 544 B8 

7;7/1/1nr\ 

A. Pioneer 30 Watt 
Component Stereo System 
• Integrated 30 watt stereo amp 
• Semi-auto direct drive turntable 
• Cassette deck w/dolby NR 
• 3 Way 60 watts speakers 
• Spacesaver audio cabinet 
• No 3000 

B. Pioneer 20 Watt 
Component Stereo System 
• Integrated amplifier (SA410) 
• AM -FM stereo tuner 
• Semi-auto direct drive 
turntable •Cassette deck 
with dolby NR •2 Way 
shelf speakers 

• No 2000 

WALMART 

A.$733 t 
B $644 

• .1 

• W PAwletot Sell he I  es  • Wel Me, 	 Is he Was 1% ,  S i„, Less • Wel Merl Sells lot Le, • Wei M 	Sells I, L 	• Wel Mel• 5e1 el. a• W,I Merl Sells • Wel Most Sous feel 

Beta Kappa preps 

for Christmas 

Members at Beta Kappa 
met in the home of Louise 
Fisher on December 8 to 
hold a business session and 
to decorate a large Christ-
mas tree for the benefit cof-
fee and the club's Christmas 
party. 

Committee 	chairmen 
reported on a successful 
Strudel sale and agreed to 
comply with popular 
demand for a repeat on 
December 19 at Fischer 
Market. However, the sup-
ply of strudel, apple and 
cheese, is limited and 
Customers are urged to buy 
early. 

Also reported was the 
distribution of Advent bags 
to residents of St. Richard's 
Villa. Members also voted to 
increase the Love Fund to 
$200. Also they agreed to in-
clude other area schools in 
the Beta Kappa scholarship 
fund, instead of only Muen-
ster schools. 

SNAP hold its 

Christmas party 
Senior Citizens of Muen-

ster who attended the SNAP 
program at the Community 
Center Tuesday, held a gift 
exchange and Christmas 
party at 3 p.m. The party 
was preceded by the usual 
SNAP luncheon at noon 
which was followed by the 
observance of December bir-
thdays. 

Honorees were Joe and 
Anna Walter and Bonnie 
Beard all of Gainesville, 
John Kupper, Julie Cun-
ningham, Bertha Pick and 
Charlie E. Wimmer, all of 
Muenster. 

The November birthday 
honorees were Hilda 
Pautler, Leo Henscheid, 
Albert B. Knabe, Sr. all of 
Muenster and Edna Deckard 
of Gainesville. 

During the Christmas par-
ty on Dec. 15, special 
decorations included small 
glass Christmas tree center-
pieces, filled with red and 
green crepe paper ornamen-
ts. These stood on silver 
placemats, with red candles. 
A large lighted Christmas 
tree dominated the 
decorations. 

Health Dept. to 
conduct clinics 
Two clinics conducted by 

the Texas Department of 
Health, Region 5, will be 
held in the Community Cen-
ter next Wednesday, 
December 23. At each clinic 
the service will be performed 
by public health nurses at no 
charge. 

The first clinic, from 10 to 
noon, will provide im-
munization against dip-
t heria-tetanus-pertussis 
(DTP), polio, rubeala (red 
measles) and rubella (Ger-
man measles) for infants 2 
months through 18 years. 
Exception: females over age 
12 will not receive rubella 
vaccine without a physicians 
consultation and prescrip-
tion. Immunizations are in-
complete if a child has not 
received three doses of DTP 
and polio with at least one 
dose administered past the 
fourth birthday. 

All children under 18 
must have an informed con-
sent form read and signed by 
a parent or legal guardian. 

The second clinic is for 
hypertension and will be 
held from 1 to 3 p.m. 

Personals... 
To visit grandmothers 

Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Needham and son Tony of 
Lynchburg, Va. spent Sun-
day and Monday with 
Mike's grandmother, Mrs. 
Ruth Needham. They were 
enroute to San Antonio to 
spend the Christmas 
holidays with Mrs. Mike 
Needham's mother.  

COMPLETE 

FUNERAL 

SERVICE 

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home 

759 4422 

• 

• 

2 

• 
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27or 36/ears 
"Exquisite Wedding Attire" 

it WEDDING GOWNS 
• Bridesmaids Dresses 
• Mothers dresses 
• Flower Girls Dresses 

* FORMALS FOR ALL 
OCCASIONS 
• Prom. i Pa-:s 
• cock:a:: 

* ACCESSORIES 
• Bridal Head Pieces 

* TUXEDO RENTALS 
• Weddings 
• Formal Attire 

We Welcome Appointments 

For the Bridal Part 

111 North Dixon 

Downtown Gainesville 

665-4971 

Beautiful 
Carpeting 

for the 
Holidays 

Dales Carpet Shop 
3r9  N Cor^ ,,erce Gamesome 665-2208 

.irts 

ff.11"Ue:=. rfi 
The Saving Ptac - 

Men's & Boys' 

Outerwear 

30% off 

MATTEL 

Intellvision TV 
TV Game 

Reg. $248.00 

NOW 229
00 

 

TOSHIBA Stereo 
Radio AM/FM 

Cassette Recorder 
Reg. $129.97 

NOW 5 88 00  

 

Jewelry 

Boxes 

25% off 

   

811 East Highway 82 • Gainesville. Tx. 

SHOE 
SALE 
25 to 50 % °FF 

More Shoes Added! 

20% OFF 
Ladies' 

Western Boots 

ChrioirrtaJ 

ling ..00cb 
from H&W Meat Co. 

Gift Packs 
Made with H&W 

• German or 

Summer Sausage 

• Smoked or 
Muenster Cheese 

Gift Certificates 

HAW 
Hams 

Call 
759-2744 

Let us prepare gifts for your relatives, friends 

or employees, for a delicious Christmas 

HO Meat Co. 
5th at Mesqu,te, Muenster 
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r"44C"1(141414t{4414-1(44n Poster contest winners named 
Christmas Special 

on v 
Vacuum Cleaners 

✓
Kirby, Eureka, Hoover 

and 

si 

• 

Sewing Machines 

V 

y Gainesville Sew-Vac 
V 
V 328 E. California, 665-9812 

(Across from Post Office) 

by Singer 

The National Fore,' Ser-
,ice annual tree hand poster 
contest is as held in Nos cm-
tier for ‘luens(er children 
and co-sponsored hs the 
Muenster Garden Club. 

Three categories included 
"Smokey the Bear" on Fire 
Prevention; "Woodsy Owl" 
on Litter Control and Anti-
Pollution; and an open 
category for any other en-
vironmental topic. 

High School winners were 
as follows: Smokey the Bear 
Posters, in order named: 
Sherri Muller, Susie 
Felderhoff, Donna Truben-
bach. Woodsy Owl Posters, 
in order named: Shawn 
Voth, Tim Voth, David 
Muller, Chris Dangelmayr. 
Environmental Posters, in 
order named; Carol Walter-
scheid, Tommy 
Dangelmayr, Mark Miller, 
Judy Gonsalves. 

Bluebonnet Junior Gar-
den Club winners were as 
follows in order named: 
Woodsy Owl Posters: Lisa 
Schilling, Jennifer Walter, 
Vickie Bayer and the 
following honorable men-
tions, Misty Vogel, Chris 
Hess, Gregg Hess. En-
vironmental Posters: Mark 
Flusche, Kristen Klement, 
Jami Flusche and the 
following honorable men-
tions, Cindy Schilling, 
Shirley Henscheid, Gussie 
Felderhoff, Bernice Bartel. 
Smokey the Bear Posters: 
Melanie Wilde, Scott Wilde, 
Beth Hoedebeck and the 
following honorable men-
tions Jason Frost, Stevan 
Nasche, Dana Hess. 
Helmuth Koelzer, Darren 
Klement. Scot Hennigan, 
Cheramie Moster, Gars 
Hess. 

Muenster Junior Garden 
Club winners were as 
follows in order named, 
Smokey, the Bear Posters, 
Deane Bayer, Eddie 
Lamkin, Werner Becker and 
honorable mentions Barry 
Hess and April Trueben-
bach. Woodsy Owl Posters, 
Mandy Barnhill, Angela 
Hofbauer, Melissa Miller 
and honorable mentions 
Stacie Cler, Christy Yosten, 
Martin McCoy, Toni Reiter. 
Aaron Berres, Jordan John-
ston. Environmental Posters 
Julie felderhoff, Becky 
Beyer, Michelle Hennigan. 

Awards were given for the 
top 3 winners in each 
category and have been for-
warded to compete at the 
district level. Each entrant re 
ceived a gift packet of seeds 
from Hofbauer's Food and 
Locker service. 

--- 
Another major contest co-

sponsored by the National 
Council of Garden Clubs 
and the Muenster Garden 
Club, will conclude in 
January, with divisions for 
Posters, Essays and Speech. 

The poster contest is open 
to grades one through 8. The 
essay contest, new this year, 
is open to grades 7, 8, 9. The 
speech contest is open to 
grades 10, II, 12, between 
ages of 15-19. 

This year the Reader's 
Digest will co-sponsor the 
speech contest at the 
national level and is offering 
the national winner a 55,000 
scholarship. 

The local deadline for 
these contests is December 
15. Topic for this year is 
"Challenge of the 80s: 
Ecological Disaster or Plan- 

NEEREIPMEMEMONMEIREME 

Top winners of the poster contests are shown with Mrs. 
Alice Roark, garden Club president. 

First Grade: I. to r. Mandy Barnhill, Julie Felderhoff. 
Deann Bayer. 

Second Grade: I. to r. Lisa Schilling. Melanie Wilde, 
Mark Flusche. 

High School: Sherrie Muller, Carol Walterscheld, 
Sharon Voth. 

ned Growth." More infor-
mation may be obtained 
from Mrs. James Roark, 
759-4518. 

Miller Baptism 
The infant son of Mr. and 

Mrs. Alan Miller, Bryan 
John, was baptized on Sun-
day, December 13 at 1:30 
p.m., with Father Stephen 
Eckart officiating in Sacred 
Heart Church. 

An uncle and aunt, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Flusche were 
baptismal sponsors. 

The baby wore the family 
keepsake christening gown 
made by Mrs. Albert Kubis, 
his great-grandmother. 

Attending were the gran-
dparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Adam Wolf and Mr. and 
Mrs. W.J. Miller; and aunts 
Margie Klement, and Karen 
and Sharen Wolf; a cousin 
Gregg Flusche, and the 
baby's brother, Eric and 
their parents. 

All were guests in the 
Alan Miller home following 
the church service. 

CDA packs 28 
shut in baskets 
The CDA meeting 0: 

Thursday, December 10 
featured an annual pre-
holiday practice of Court 
No. 249 when the members 
prepare gift packs of fruit, 
candy and cookies. This 
year 28 baskets were packed 
for local shut-ins. 

Members heard the report 
of a special committee that 
prepared a Sunday luncheon 
for about 50 persons who at-
tended the diocesan lay-
ministries program. 

Per capita Tax sent to the 
National Headquarters 
amounted to S149.00 an-
nually, 51.00 per member. 

The annual Christmas gif-
ts for Sacred Heart pastor 
and assistant pastor were in-
cluded during the meeting, 
and a gift fruit basket was 
arranged for Benedictine 
nuns. 

Preparation of gifts for 
shut - ins followed the 
business meeting. 

Open until 8 p.m. Thursda■ 

,i.s1;•• 
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Jhanb you 
My children and I have a deep feeling of 

gratitude. to all those who came so 
quickly to help us when we needed them. 
especially Father Stephen Eckart. and nur-
ses Judy Flusche and Mickey Haverkamp: 
also for the prompt response of the am-
bulance service. the care and concern of 
the doctors and staff of Muenster 
Memorial Hospital. We will treasure the 
memory of every kindness. courtesy and 
favor offered to us by relatives. neighbors 
and friends and we are grateful for the 
Many Mass intentions, flowers. and food 
sent to our homes. Also for the help of 
those who prepared and served the family 
dinner and the Knights of Columbus who 
provided a place to gather. It is especially 

comforting to us to remember the special 
Liturgy. the four priests who con-celebrat 
ed. Fathers Placidus Eckart. Harry Fisher. 
Denis Soerries and Stephen Eckart: and 

the beauty of the music by the Sacred 

Heart Choral Group, 

The family of Frank Herr 
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W.C. Electric 
Specializing in Oil Field 

Electric equipment 
Single phase, three phase & phase converters 

W.C. Muller 	7594517 

Mobile phone 665-8561 Unit 416 
Home phone 726-3613 

l ROI 

United Electric Service 

Qua  f ry  W0,h - ,7ai, /9,.k 

C.M. Muller, Harold Alexander 
759-4517 nights & holidays, 637-2330 

XIS 

Zimmerer 	and 	Mrs. 
Imogene Zimmerer for a 
quilt and a simulated stained 
glass picture, which were 
donated as fund raisers at 
the turkey supper. 

After refreshments, ser-
ved by Mrs. Raymond 
Zimmerer and Mrs. William 
Hermes, members decorated 
the tree and building for the 
Christmas party. The party 
consisted of group singing, 
Christmas readings by 
Stephen and Wayne Becker, 
a gift exchange and refresh-
ments of pick-up foods. 

Next meeting date was set 
for Monday, Jan. 4. 

VFW Auxiliary has 
annual party 

Santa Claus made his an-
nual visit to the VFW Club 
Tuesday morning, Decem-
ber I5, much to the delight 
of the 15 children gathered 
there to await his arrival. 
Seated beside a large 

decorated Christmas tree, 
Santa Claus listened to each 
child's gift suggestions. He 
then gave each child a toy 
compliments 	of 	the 
Auxiliary. The Children 
sang a medley of Christmas 
carols before he made his 
departure. 

Guests 	were 	served 
cookies, Cokes and coffee 
provided by the VFW and 
11te Auxiliary. The VFW 
Christmas party is held each 
year for the children of the 
VFW and its Ladies 
Auxiliary. 

Santa's assistants this year 
were Irma Koelzer, Agnes 
Hesse, 	Ethel 	Hesse, 
Laujuana Klement, Frances 
Bayer, Flora Mae Knabe, 
and Linda Knabe. 

The Hood Community 
Club had two meetings in 
December, a business 
session on the 7th and a 
social meeting featuring a 
Christmas party on the 11th. 

The principal subject of 
the earlier meeting was the 
centennial book project. 
Each member received a list 

of ads to be sold and turned 
in early in February. Also 
J.T. Barker asked for 
donations to United Fund 
and Mrs. Mary Hermes gave 
the treasurer's report and a 
report on income from the 
turkey supper. 

Special thanks were ex-
tended to Mrs. Raymond 

u. 
II OH 
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LN 
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Slab Sli. Bacon 	 

t rfD x0.11 BFEI 

Seven Roast 

Loin Tip Cube Steak 
C lassic Boneless Ham OHIO! HOLLOW  

. rFD xFRVY BFFr 

Seven Steak 
Pork Liver 

IN OUR DAIRY DEPARTMENT  

Shurfresh Cream Cheese 

1-02.PACEIGE 

SL4EX0IS11.1A001011E 

Soft Spread 	2 LII.:1'° 
rnrFfF. 

68 6  

Cheese  
3MXIF00IM I.d. Oil. 

Amer. Cheese Food 	o,°:: `1" 
OSIIFI1SX 

French Onion Dip 	NMI. 39e 
$NIlFIESI-NNb,.. SA.Ad.. 

Half Moon Horn 	Pt'. $1" 

Attends seminar 
Robert 	E. 	LaCoe, 

registered medical 
technologist at Muenster 
Memorial Hospital , updated 
technology and skill at a 
seminar 	sponsored 	by 
Region III of the American 
Society for Medical 
Technology at Biloxi, Miss, 
Nov. 11-14. 

While there he attended 
three 4-hour sessions and 
one 3-hour session on 
Microbiologist and Infec-
tion Control, Basic 
Anaerobic 	Bacteriology, 
Complications in Pre-
transfusion Testing; and 
Small Instrument 
Troubleshooting. 

The educational sessions 
as well as the exhibits were 
designed to enhance one's 
knowledge of laboratory 
medicine, to improve care 
and to reduce hospital cost. 

Christmas dance 

announced by CYO 
Members of the St. 

Mary 's CYO have announ-
ced a Christmas Dance to be 
held Sunday, dec. 27, 8:30-
12:30 in St. Mary's Hall. 
Proceeds are intended for 
the Ronald McDonald 
Home in Fort Worth and a 
trophy case fund for St. 
Mary's Hall. 

Little John's Disco will 
provide music and ad-
mission charges are $3 per 
person and $5 per couple. 
Special attraction are door 
prizes and dance contests. 

Hospital 
Notes 

Hi 

$1 00   
cs. SF W.E. GOLDEN 

Corn 	') 100 2 . 5 11 9A     
EARLY MAnrE$T 

	

Peas  	3  11 02. S tl 9 
DASS 

SNXIF1SEM1STIL 

SOLAR, SIN 

SNOIFISE— I.r...I,.. 

White Syrup 	 "JAR  99° 

Cut Yams 	 89° 

Cherries 	 SIZE 89 0  
SH XIF.E— I 1 00 10.11,100........ 

Fruit Cocktail 	LIRE 590 

SW ASSOS 

Chicken Broth 	 11 CARS $1°° 
IIAFT-II.I.Ie,... J.I PeN 

Marshmallows  	79 0  
SIITT—IIIINIALLIW 

Creme 	 T1:. 65 0  
SNUIFISE—IDS P0*1E1E0 

LE sOruRJlm 

Sweet Peas 	CAN 53 0  
I051LE 

Choc. Morsels 	'PIG. $199 
NESTU—.0.o I' I. Narshw.11.. 

Hot Cocoa Mix 	 12PHI $1" 
ON0(0LA TO 

Nestle Quik 	 'G:  $2" 
II. COFFEE 

Coffee Filters 	IEOCT69 0  
swDl 
Chicken Vienna 	31'1 00  

Pet Milk 
2  11X3 sl°° _ 

III$ 

INIIFISE-101 P0111010 

Sugar 	  I.tu 39° 

Lt. Brown Sugar $5100100I U I01 39 0  } 	FROZEN FOOD SPECIALS  

or 

Lowenbrau Special 

Lowenbrau Dark $2 39  

7 Up 

6 PK 12 02 BOTTLES 

$ 109 
2 LITER 

HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS 

LIQOID 

 Prell Shampoo 	11 02. BTL. $ S9 1 
Baby Shampoo SNURFINE 

	 1002.990 

Baby Oil M 03303X0 
	 TO 00. $ 129 

Baby Powder NURFINE 	 1102. DAN j  1 09 1  
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Hood Club meets twice in December 

We Have A Large Selection of 
Butterballs & Tender Young Geese 
For Your Holiday Needs. 

U.S.D.A. Gr. "A" Baking Hens 671  	LD 59° 
Smoked Turkeys HICkO Ỳ SNOEED FOLLY 000KED 

	
LB. $ 19 

Young Ducklings"'DE 	1 " 	 LB. 99° 

Smoked Ham 
	 PORTION 
D-I Li. Ace. 
WNOr IU.1 
	 u. 

SIT! PNLT.I-,.t.,Added 

Nam l' Li 
 

NOlO N PIIl1NI-Weds Added 

Ham 	
 

HALF OR .NOLE-RN., AAdN 
Ham IS-11 Lb. 1.1. 

99C 
s"IRFNE10-N0.LOOS-34 U, A.. 

fbll02.11lI.1 
Ham I-I Lb. H.I. 	  

XORNn—A....... 

FRESH F105TE0 

Fryer Gizzards 	 
FRISK 1110100 

Fryer Livers _ __ 	 
OSIRRRE11 

Sliced Bacon 	 
Dw. rE ° xuvY offE 

Sirloin Steak 

f  1 " 
1N 

Cure 81 Ham : 	L  

69° 

IL 59° 
5119 

u. 91 29 
Li 

	 u.
t1dB 

STAR 

LA. $599 Sliced Bacon 	P;: °1" 3 C.. 

_ 	
[xfRi [EATER LD1010

^ ,- 	̂ 	Pork Chops 
1CHFR$ CF.1fR RIB 

Pork Chops 

Pure Pork Sausage ';";'; ;;,";;;'•''' """• 
TURKEY 

HENS 
12-14 LD. AVG. 

lb. 5 

18-24 LB. AVG. WEIGHT COFFEE 

Shurfine  ' 
Rq., Drip ,  EI.Otrio Pork 	,:.;ii; 	f 

Coffee 4RYa Ff D xFIVT eEEr 

Shoulder Arm Roast 
T[xERS 

Pork Tenders 
Extra Lean Ground Chuck 	  

Ll.e I Per F..ur With $10.00 NI.i.B. Pll,.hu. 

1 CAN ' 39 

WHOLE 
COUNTY FAIR 

MARGARINE—QUARTERS 

Parkay 48 Lb.  Cln. 
PARNIo 

LIGHT FLOUR CRUST 

S Le. 

 

68 uc 

Ham Halves LX $ 1 B9  
IwN., udea 

Li.M 1 ►u Fa.il1 With 910.00 Ni.i.N ■ Pur.h Osd 

LIIIT CAIOT—HOST. 

Pouch Mixes 	 

4

5 
 N 02. 00 00 

PIGS. 	 1 

X.'03. $100 
P.". 

1502. $109 
JAR 

COIT NOFFIO 

Jiffy Mix 	 
•ANI-4TII3wIE0Ir 

Preserves 	  
LOSS! LOAF 

Cherry Pie Filling 
TIIPPET SHALL 

Whole Yams 	 
OCEAI OPIAT—J.III.d 	 

Sauce 	  
SOONER, II SINUS. P11111 

Vlasic Spears 	 
IICIO tEl'S 

Rice 

2200. $129 
-- 	SHURFRESH 

Supreme 

Ice Cream 
Assorted Flavors 

IT O?. 6 9C CHI 	.7 

ISO?. 55 ° OAS 

210?. ppF 
JAR 77 

ISO?. BBC 
	 SRI 

2 'CI s 88° 

^ ' S9 
LIMIT TWO 

1/2 CTN. 

$0551100 (YAP. 

s Milk 	  
EAGLE SOLID 
III. II CI. IAN 	tl' 

Sugar 	  2LI.POLY 18 0  

Lt. Brown Sugar IMQNFITE 
	213 POLT 180 

Down 

Fabric Softener 	 
Reynolds Foil 	 

Cheer Detergent 

MORTON PIES 
Hefty 9" Plate SNMOS.E 

	N1m $1" 

Cascade I l[TEOEEIT 	 1002. 9199 

Clorox Bleach  	,GAILNI 88 0  
W0 5 5110 10 5 FANCY RED 

MINCE Or 
PUMPKIN 	 9 

24 OZ. PEG. 

I 	EIRE SSDRIfo 
Detergent 

Pizzas 	 99 0 ' 

DELICIOUS APPLES 	LB. 4P 
California Stalk Celery 	EACH 39C 

OSUIFIU-0 02 

Whipped Topping 	 68° 
NEADNerl.rHn. 

Rolls  	24C1.PlL. 59° 
ITS IADRXEf OR 11111 

Onions 	 
$0101$1 	 

Tangerines .,.. .. ILIS. $ 1 00  
INRIFIUE 2-t I.oI 

Pie Shells 	2PII 58° 
$100 

Ole" 
LAOGE PAPEISNELL 

0,100115—N loch—? P.H 

Deep Dish Pie Shells 	18° 
II.ITO.—I$s0'Tr1 

Dinners 	
l 	79° 

Walnuts 	u. 6 1 19  Pecans 	 X $1" The Muenster Memorial 
Hospital dismissals for this 
past week were as follows: 

Mon. Dec. 7 - Victor Har-
tman, Shirley Endres and 
baby girl, Muenster; Ken 
Lyons, Saint Jo; Lucie 
Boyd, Rosston Linda Den- 
nis, Bobby .toe Schutes. 
Saint Jo; Wm. P. Orrell, 
Forestburg; 	Hardy 	C. 
Bullard. Era. 

Tues. Dec. 8 - Al Schmitt, 
Muenster; Lucille Littleton, 
Gainesville; Weldon Griffis, 
Saint Jo ; Daryl Ferguson 
Kingston, Okla.; Todd 
Hammer, Bowie; Julio Mar-
cos, Mesquite. 

Wed. Dec. 9 - Helen Dun-
bar, Cliff Massey, Muen-
ster; Felipa Garcia and baby 
girl, Valley View. 

Thur. Dec. 10 - Leta Mc-
Daniel, Muenster; Allen 
Blodgett, Wichita Falls. 

Fri. 	Dec. 	II- 	Nettie 
Scoggins, Myra (Expired) 

Sat. Dec. 12 - Mary 
Koelzer, Muenster; Steven 
brewer, Saint Jo; Regina 
Scott, gainesville. 

Sun. Dec. 13 - Telisha 
Reid, Lou Wolf (expired), 
Muenster? Lou Ann Chap-
man, Saint Jo. 

EAST TOOLS II. I SWIFT TELLOW 

Potatoes 	1..39° 
SIPER RELICT 

Cucumbers 	$ 1 00  $ 1 00  SOON 

GLEEM 	TUBE $1' 9 
FLUONIDE TOOTNPISTE 

0ECRET-0aI. A Ous..l.d  
BOO. S 59 Antiperspirant 	C AN 2 

LIKE YOUR FOOD STORE 

REALLY OUGHT TO BE! 

AFFILIATED  

We will close at 4:00 p.m. Christmas Eve. Prices effective December 18 through 24, 1981 

1927 
JI'thr1rr'i Ulrat :!1ttrke# Since  

304 N. Main, 759-4211, 7594217 a nn 



Ladies Pants 

1 TABLE 

Boys pants 

8 5 00 
	 per pair  

28 0 ° per pair 

Haircutting  days 

left till Christmas 

Better hurry down! 

riiT7ERS NORTH 
OPEN 6 DAYS A WEEK 

Grand Plaza Gainesville 665-1522 

.101 

995 2103. Saint Jo, Texas 

Special Buys For Late Shoppers 

1 RACK LADIES 

Robes & Gowns 1/2 of now price 

1 RACK LADIES 

Blouses 	1/2 of now price 

Ladies Uniforms 	 25% off 

LADIES 

Boots & Shoes 	1/2 of now price 

1 RACK 

1 RACK 

Men's Robes 	Y2 of now price 

r 
Seaiort3 reelinV 

Daniel Boone Discount 
Dec. 17, 18, 19 

Reserve your wedding date early for fine 
quality, creative photography. 

201 Clay, Nocona Tx. 

817-825-6326 

Closed Mondays 
xo 

 

BUFFET 
Every Wednesday Evening 

Help yourself to all you can eat 

Enchiladas 	Guacamole Salad 

Burritos 	Refried Beans 

Spanish Rice 	Tortilla Chips 

Margarita's moo  

THE CENTER 
Restaurant & Tavern 

. 2 L Division 
Tue. . 

Dec 20, 1981 Date 

i HESSTON I 

rime 8:00 p.m. 	L  

	The 
PRIME LINE 

c'n'i $7.50* 
st..„., Channel 11 	KTVT 

Sponsored locally by 1981 
S&W Tractor 	Huston 

Interstate 35 et Hwy 82 	Collector's Buckles 

Gainesville 

Seafood Fresh From The Coast 

Seafood Buffet Friday & Saturday 
5:00 P.M. - 9:00 P.M. 

shrimp (Boiled & Fried) 
Hush Puppies 

Salad Bar 

Gainesville Shopping Center 665-4871 
Open Tue, Sat. 	Hwy. 82 East 
It A.M. - 9 P.M. 	 Gainesville 

James & Yvonne Moffett 
Owners 

Catfish 
Potatoes 

Frog Legs 

.s s. 

tO Now Open All Day Saturday 
We will be open Dec. 2 I - 24 till 8 p.m.:: 

It 

 For your Christmas Shopping Convenience f, 

p-Tuhrinannts1 rittrIrg s_ 

217 N Main. Mur,ster, 759-2939 

p,pppopOpOpOgollpOpOpOpOpOp.OpOp Op OpOpOprapCp 

, t3 

.0 , 0  

Beals Gainesville 

Shopping Center 

Royal Blue satin nylon jacket with warm 

white flannel lining. Snap front with ribbed 
collar, cuff and waist, slosh pockets. Sizes 
7.1 4 

14 

ire 

Co 

IN 
00 
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C 

Li 
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The four high school 
basketball teams of Muen-
ster returned home with four 
trophies from the weekend 
tournament at Forestburg. 
Sacred Heart Tigers were 
runners-up for the charn-
pionship, receiving the No. 2 
prize and the Tigerettes were 
No. 3. Muenster High's 
Hornets won the contest for 
No. 3 and the Hornettes lost 
for third, receiving the No. 4 
award. 

In addition both schools 
received recognition in the 
selection of all tournament 
teams. The players were 
Susan Walterscheid and 

Gene Fuhrman of Sacred 
Heart and Kevin Felderhoff 
of Muenster High. 

The tourney opened with 
MHS opposing the Gold-
burg teams and SHHS op-
posing Era. All of Muen-
ster's four teams were win-
ners and continued in the 
championship brackets. 

In the next games Sacred 
Heart met Forestburg, the 
Tigers winning and the 
Tigerettes losing. Muenster 
High lost to Lindsay in both 
of the second games. 

As winners the Tigers ad-
vanced to the champ contest 
with Lindsay. As semifinal  

losers, Muenster and Sacred 
Heart Heart then contested 
for third place, the Tigerettes 
winning and the Hornettes 

losing. Also, the Hornets 
played Forestburg for third, 
Muenster being the winner. 

The separate games 
progressed as follows. 

MHS girls 39-Goldberg 34 

The game was close all the way. 
the Hornettes taking an 11-9 lead 
the first period and holding the 2 
point margin for counts of I'-15 
and 28-26 and gaining slightly in the 
fourth for the 39-34 win. Scorers 
were Charlotte Fleitman 12. 
Stephanie Richey 10. Jill Walter-
scheid 8, Mary Winn 6. Carla 
Walterscheid 2, Kyla Hale I. 

MHS boys 51 Goldberg 47 

The Homes appeared to have it 
under control for three periods, for 
leadsof 11-6. 29-20 and 39-32 but a 
Goldburg rally tied the count as 43-
43 at the final buzzer. In overtime 
Muenster had the hot streak and 
soared to a St-47 final count. Tim 
Schneider led the scoring at 20. 
Kevin Felderhoff added 16. Dale 
Swirczynski 9, Wayne Carroll 4, 
lames Huckaby 2. 

MHS girls 26 Lindsay 70 

Lindsay's power house had a 
scoring spree leading 65-12 at the 
end of the third period and the last 
quarter. with Lindsay reserves 
playing was even with 14 for each 
side. Homette scorers were 
Charlotte Heitman 7. Stephanie 
Richey 6, Kyla Hale 3, Sandy 
Wimmer, Jill Walterscheid, Mary 
Winn, Nancy Walterscheid and 
Sherrie Hess. each 2. 

MHS boys 43 Lindsay 51 

With a 20-13 first quarter lead. 
the Knights added a point to their 
margin in the rest of the game for 
the 51-43 win. Kevin Felderhoff 
had a big game with 26 points as 
Wayne Carroll hit 8, Gary Klement 
4, Tint Schneider 3, James 
Huckaby 2, Dale Swirczynski 1. 

MHS Oda 37 Sacred Heart 31 

Homettes took the first quarter 
lead 8-5 but strong second and third 
periods favored the Tigerettes by 
counts of 22 - 17 and 30-19. Sacred 
Heart gave up some of the margin 
in the fourth, ending with a 6 point 
margin. The game decided third 
and fourth places of the tourney. 

MHS scorers were Jill Walter-
scheid II. Sandy Wimmcr 8, 
Stephanie Richey 6, Carla Walter-
scheid 2, Charlotte Fleitman 2, 
Kyla Hale 2. Tigerette scorers were 
Carol Walterscheid 14, Susan 
Walterscheid 12, Laurie Endres 6. 
Anne Felderhoff 5. 

MHS boys 42 Forestborg 27 

The Hornets gained in every 
period for leads I, 5, 7 and 15 poin-
ts in the showdown for third place 
trophy. Wayne Carroll was the high 
point man with 15, Tim Schneider 
had 9, Kevin Felderhoff 8, Gary 
Klement 4, James Huckaby 4, Dale 
Swirczynski 2. 

SH girls 40, Ers 26 

After a slow start for leads of 8-6 
and 16-14 the Tigerettes took over 
and extended the margin to 22-16 
and 40-26 in the third and fourth . 

Tigerette scorers were Sic, 
Walterscheid 14 (plus 15 rebound , 

 Anne Felderhoff 12. Carol Waite, 
scheid 10, Laurie Endres 2, Sondra 
Hess 2. 

SH boys 87 Era 43 

The Tigers did as they pleased in 

rolling over Era by a ratio of more 
than 2 to I and TJ Waltersceid led 
the way with 21 points. Others were 
Gene Fuhrman 18, Greg Walter-
scheid 12 (plus 14 rebounds) Brian 
Herr II, Duane Haverkamp 7, Hal 
Mollenkopf 6, Gene Haverkamp 5, 
Neil Hesse 5, Darrell Herr 2. 

SH girls 30 Forest burg 34 

The game was close all the way, 
Forestburg leading by 2 at the first 
and second periods, however SH 
led briefly in the second quarter. 
Then Forestburg took over again 
for leads of 2 at the third and 4 at 
the end. Fouls were the principal 
difference, Forestburg with 3 and 
Sacred Heart with 16. Susan 
Walterscheid and Anne Felderhoff 
shared the scoring lead with 10 
each, Laurie Endres had 6 and 
Carol Walterscheid 4. 

SH boys 69 F °minors 37 

After a 9-9 first period Ile the 

Tigers surged to a 25-13 lead. In the 

third they gale If margin. leading 
3628. then took off on a 33 point 

scoring spree while the opponents 
hit only 9. The end result Mat a 32 

point win. Tiger scorers were Brian 
Herr 15. Neil Hesse 14. Gene 
Fuhrman II (plus 10 rebounds), 
Greg Walterscheid 10. Darrell Herr 
9. T1 Walterscheid 8. Gene 
HaYerkarnp 2. 

SH boys 33 Lindsay 47 

The game started with a 8 -8 lie 
after which the Knights jumped to a 
27-18 half time lead and gained in 
the third and fourth for leads of 10 
and 14 points. Poor shooting was 
the big SH factor: only 16 out of 66 
tries. Scoring for SH were Neil 
Hesse 15, Ti Walterscheid 6. Brian 
Herr 6. Gene Fuhrman 4. 

SH Juniors split 2 
at Prairie Valley , 
Junior high teams of 

Sacred Heart broke even at 
Prairie Valley Tuesday 
night, the girls dropping a 
23-22 heartbreaker and the 
boys winning 21-16. 

The sadness of the girls 
game resulted from a tur-
nover on a SH pass. After 
the steal PV moved in for an 
easy layup and the I point 
lead in the last minute. In 
the remaining seconds SH 
was unable to recover. The 
scorers were Sandra Walter-
scheid 7, Tammy Hess 7, 
Lydia Walterscheid 3, Leslie 
Hess 3, Paula Yosten I, 
Laura Flusche 1. 

The Tigers gained in 3 
quarters for leads of 10-2, 
13-6 and 21-8 then turned 
over the game to reserves in 
the fourth. During that time 
Prairie Valley took up some 
of the slack and ended at 21-
16. Ken Hesse hit 7 for SH, 
John Nasche added 6, John 
Mangum 6 and Keith Hen-
nigan 2. 

Tigers win 7443 
at Prairie Valley 

The Tigers had an easy one 
Tuesday night rolling over 
Prairie Valley by a count of 
74-48. After a first quarter 
of 20-6 they improved their 
margin in the remaining 
periods by gains of I, 6 and 
5 points. 

The SH scorers were Greg 
Walterscheid 14 (plus 13 
rebounds), Neil Hesse 16, 
TJ Walterscheid 14, Brian 
Herr 12, Gene Fuhrman 10, 
Darrell Herr 4, Hal 
Mollenkopf 3, Curtis Hen-
scheid 1. 

Coming Games 
Next on the Sacred Heart 

schedule is a tournament at 
Krum with Celina as the 
Tigers first opponent and 
Valley View as the Tigerettes 
first opponent. 

Monday the boys will play 
Gainesville and the girls will 
play Muenster, both games 
at Sacred Heart. 

And both teams will meet 
Valley View at 7 Tuesday in 
the Sacred Heart gym. 

Hudspeth youths 
get swim awards 

John and Kelly Hudspeth 
children of the Daniel Hud-
speths of Dallas and gran-
dchildren of the Paul 
Walterscheids of Muenster, 
received top honors at an 
awards banquet for the 
Eastgate Athletic Club Swim 
Team on Dec. 7, 1981 in 
Garland. 

Kelly received the age 13-
14 most Valuable Swimmer 
trophy and John received 
the Izod Award trophy, as 
the top swimmer of the en-
tire team. 

John is the only swimmer 
of the 70 swimmers on the 
team to qualify for a 
National Meet to be held in 
Austin in January. 

Phone 759-4311 to 
report news items, or 
send notes to Box 190, 
Muenster. 

SPORTS 	  

Muenster teams win 4 tourney trophies 

N 



CHRISTMAS 
SPECIAL 

THE CLASS 
OF THE 
CLASS 

• 4-cylinder DOHC engine with 
Twin Dome combustion 
chambers • Shaft drive • Tran-
sistorized ignition • Slotted 
front and rear disc brakes • Two-
tone color • Leading axle front 
air forks • Fuel gauge 
• Quartz-halogen headlight 
• Tubeless, raised white letter 
tires • Gear position indicator 
• Fingertip choke lever 
• 12-month unlimited mileage 
warranty• 

• see time., Warranty" brochure for dela!, 

ABOVE Ail 

Gainesville Cycles 
201 Summit 665-5032 

Areas For Unwanted 
Nair Removal 

stcy• — 

Bach — 

Ume saie 

ete 

See 

REMOVAL 
OF 

UNWANTED 
HAIR 

By 

Electrolysis-Thermolysis 

The ONLY Permanent 

and Medically 

Approved Way 

Gently-Safely 

7ustaiac'4 .  
Locansee 

Of Gainesville 

Tessa Largest Elet1eo1ys,s Clinics 

SPEKISTS-REGISTINT BECRIOLOGISTS 

I MEMBER AEA-ESA-SEA-ASE-EATAll 
Accredited try Directory at  Professional Balrolosats 

Frs. 	 Write For Fr s. 	 Closed 
Consultation 	Literature 	 Mondays 

Suite 307, First State Bank Bldg 
801 E California 	 668-8503 ,, 

Authorocil 

Vista 
BICYCLE CENTER 

(J3 N Greed 	 go, 8, 61,1an Trunk • Ownc 

Dralcr 	 Own Tuesday .  Enday. 9 to 6 	 Saturday 9 to 4 

('Iowa Mondays 	 2401 

LOOKOUT 
MONGOOSE 
ON THE  
LOOSE! 

• PARTS AND SERVICE 
AVAILABLE 

FOR FUTURE NEEDS 

Lay Away now for Christmas 

Open till 8 p.m. 
Every Wednesday & Thursday 

till Christmas 

Open Christmas Eve 

till 4 p.m. 

Tops & Teams 
211 N. Ma In, Muenster. 759 2540 

May..5.1. 9:30 a.m. to 9,301eM 

29' 
Buy any size 

Soft Drink 
and get a 

REFILL FOR ONLY 

Great Gift viv  
Selections atIams 

Warmups 
New selections of Shirts 
Big Bounce Balls 

for kids 

Basketballs Footballs 
Knit Gloves & Caps 

Gift Certificates available 

DAIRY Inn 
MUENSTER, TEXAS 

HIGHWAY 82 	759-4512 

DRIVE-THRU WINDOW 

FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE 

This Week's Special 

Our Third Series of the 
Norman Rockwell 
Holiday Glasses ouvi 	890 Including 

Drink 

Phone Orders 759-4512 	at 
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MHS teams lose 3 at Alvord W. offers Yule safety tips 
9207102121120217#12071EMEMEIM 

Ideal Christmas 

Gift Suggestions 
Christmas cards for Wallets 

Frames of all sizes 
Small set up Frames 

"We Iva you a Merry Chriifina3 "  

MathvwJ pho tograph, 
300 S. Lindsay, Gainesville, 665-2431 

REIVICIPMEMEIMME 

Tuesday was a bad 
basketball date for the teams 
of Muenster High. Both var-
sity teams and the junior 
varsity girls returned empty 
handed from a trip to 
Alvord. Their only satisfac-
tion was that each game was 
interesting in spots and 
closer than the final score 
indicated. In each case the 
Muenster teams put on extra 
pressure near the end to 
overcome an Alvord lead 
and the effort backfired. 
Muenster fouled and Alvord 
improved its margin with 
free shots. 

JV girls were first on the 
program, the Hornettes 
trailing 8-0 and .12-8 at the 
first quarters and tying the 
score at 14-14 ending the 
third period. But they could 
not hold the momentum. 
Alvord ended at the front of 
28-20. Muenster scorers 
were Jill Wimmer 6, Cindy 
Tisdale 4, Kim Eldred 4, 
Pam Hermes 2, JoEll 
Hellman 2, Jackie Farrell 2. 

The situation was very 
similar in the girls varsity 
game. MHS started slow 
and trailed 16-4 at the first 
period, then came to life for 
deficits of 20-19 and 30-27 in 
the second and third periods 
and finished with a 43-36 
loss following Alvord's 
rally. Carla Walterscheid led 
the Muenster effort with 7 
points and 15 rebounds, 
Stephanie Richey scored 10, 
Sandy Wimmer 9 Charlotte 
Fleitman 6, Kyle Hale 4. 

The girls' principal trouble 
was inability to find the 
goal. Their shooting average 
was about 20 percent. 

The 	Hornets 	varsity 
played neck and neck for 
two quarters, the scores 
being 11-11 and 25-23 
favoring Muenster. Then 
Alvord got organized and 
soared to leads of 46-37 and 
64-48. One factor is that the 
Hornets lost Kevin 
Felderhoff by fouls early in 
the fourth. It was a vital loss 
considering that he had 16 
points and about 25 reboun-
ds until then. Other scorers 
were Tim Schneider 12, 
James Huckaby 6, Wayne 
Carroll 6, Dale Swirczynski 
5, Gary Klement 3. 

Christmas is a time for 
decorating 	the 	tree, 
crackling fires, toys wrap-
ped up in brightly colored 
packages, 	gaily 	colored 
strings of lights and families 
gathered together to 
celebrate the season. 

Christmas also is a time 
for fires, many of which will 
be traced back to Christmas 
trees and decorations, and 
many of which can be 
avoided. 

"In the hustle and bustle 
of the season, it's easy to 
forget common sense safety 
rules," warns Robert 
Seelbach, Underwriters 
Laboratories vice president 
and chief electrical e.igineer. 

Underwriters Laborator-
ies Inc. (UL) is an indepen-
dent not-for-profit 
organization testing for 
public safety. Among other 
products, UL tests indoor 
and outdoor Christmas tree 
lights, artificial trees and 
electrical decorations for a 
variety of safety features. 

"Many fires are caused by 
damaged light strings, 
overloaded circuits and im-
proper use of decorations. 
At UL, we try to make these 
products as safe as possible, 
but consumers have to do 
their part too," says 
Seelbach. 

The National Fire Data 
Center reports ap-
proximately 82,000 fires 
killed or injured more than 
three thousand people and 
caused about 340 million  

dollars in property damage 
last December. 

Seelbach says consumers 
can avoid fires if they use 
simple precautions. "A 
spark or a hot wire can 
ignite a dried out tree. 
Check each string of lights 
carefully. If you find a 
break in the wiring, frayed 
insulation, a broken bulb or 
a defective plug, don't use 

S 

it; 	repleace the string," 
Seelbach says. 

Overloading a circuit with 
too many lights also can 
cause a fire. "Read 
manufacturer's instructions 
carefully and don't use more 
than the recommended 
number of lights on one cir-
cuit," says Seelbach. 

Members of the 1981 Muenster Hornette varsity are front: Mary Winn, Peggy Winn, 
Kyla Hale, Carla Walterscheid, Stephanie Richey and Sandy Wimmer; back: Shelley 
Zimmerer, Jill Walterscheid, Nancy Walterscheid, Sherri Hess, Charlotte Fleitman and 
Coach Leonard Peters. 

Muenster High varsity basketball Hornets for 1981 are, front: Wayne Carroll, James 
Huckaby, Dale Swirczynski and Garland Tate; back; Coach Alan Gustine, Bill Grewing, 
Steven Fisher, Kevin Felderhoff, Tim Schneider, Gary Klement. 

We Will Be Closed 
All Day Dec. 24 

and 
will be 

Open 5 p.m. to 12 midnight 
on Christmas Day 

,fiei  1 	Visit Our Snack Bar 
and Game Room 

icts.cas tfacathassoam Sea eceseee See shie ,  

ALL * STAR * LANES 
o Hwy. 82, Across from Gainesville Shopping Center, 668-7724 

,o.o.o.o.o.o.o.o.o.o.o.,...p.capc,etseassesemeleMMimea tssaSCsem tfiem assesses 6ficasssimi 	 eiaarseeihase 

Tops, Dresses, Pants, Jeans, 
• Overalls, Sleepwear and Jackets 

Girls Sizes - Toddler thru pre-teen 

Boys Sizes - Toddler thru size 7 

CHRISlirlit -Olt' 

Thurs., Fri. & Sat. 

20 Wo OFF 



PECANS 
Buying, Selling, Custom Cracking 

R.B. Bagley & Sons 
North 1-35, 817.885-4972, Gainesville 

1/2 mile north of Curtwood 

FOR SALE 
MOORMAN'S HI MAG MIN- 
eral now in stock at Tony's Seed 
and Feed. 	 a-XCI 

SANTA SPECIAL: 1979 HONDA 
50 Minitrail, super condition, 5235. 
Dan Hamric, 995-2469. 	aim 

FOR 	SALE: 	LOT-FED 
Holsteins, excellent 	beef 	for 
freezers. Reasonable price. Will 
deliver. 665-5623 or 665-9686.a is Ie 

FOR SALE: '70 FORD 
Mustang-fastback, Custom 2 tone 
blue, collectors condition, low 
mileage. Ph. 668-6617. 

CERAMIC TILE INSTALLAT-
ion and masonry construction. For 
estimates contact Ted Henscheid, 
759-4280, Muenster. 16xci 

FOR SALE: HOUSE PLANTS 
and Silk Flower Arrangements for 
all occasions. In-town deliveries 
free. Muenster Garden Center, 
759-2766 arXC1 

FOR SALE 
FOR SALE: 1975 CUTLASS 
Supreme 64,000 miles. Cruise, tape, 
A/C. Will take best offer. 759-
4334. 46XCI 

PRINCLIsS HOUSE PRODUCTS 
HOME PARTY SHOWS 

Eyvone Meyer, Gainesville, Tx. 
817-665-4508 	 56401 

ALFALFA HAY FOR SALE. 
Any amount. PAUL HESS. 665- 
9228. 	 12-XCI 

MODERN FLOORS AND 
Fabrics has renewal sicker. for car 
license plates. sr 

FOR SALE: USED REFRIG-
erator and washing machine. Ex-
cellent condition. Hess Furniture 
759-4455. 3-20 

FOR HOME DELIVERY OF 
Fort Worth Star Telegram or 

Dallas Times Herald 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828, Box. 546 Sanger 

Stock Panels 
521e. X 16 Ft. 

1 to 9 	 10 or more 

s16% 5 160:a. 

Metal Sales 
W. Hwy. 82,665-0336 

Gainesville 

Mon. - Fri. tii00-5:30 

I to 9 1 	10 or more 

s18 5:a  s 18% . 

Combination 
Panels 

521n. X 16 ft. 

WANT RESULTS! 
TRY THE CLASSIFIEDS 

TRACTORS 
For sale or lease 
Agriculture and 

Industry 

CASE POWER 
AND EQUIPMENT 

Albert Zimmerer 

665-4314 

New Home 

Sewing Machines 
Trade f,r. daepted 

Sewing machine repairs 
All makes & models. In our 

store or in your home.  
Gehrlg Sewing Center 

Muenster, 759-4112 	•. 

Sewing Machines 
Vacuum Cleaners 

Stereos, Tapes 
Records & Accessories 

Sales & Service 
ALL MAKES 

Hudgins 
209 W Calif., Gainesville 
Phone 665-2542 	I Is 

LEVIS 
Our Prices 

Can't Be Beat 
Boot cut-Shrink to vet Bells 

Boy's & Student's sizes 

Slim & Regular 

Commerce Street Store 
Pow BrIsco.Clalnosyllle .1151 

Current 6 month 

Money Market Rate 

11.845% 
Muenster 

State Bank 

* FREE * 
Classified Ads 

In next SHOPPER 

Call 759 - 4311 

FOR SALE 
SHELLED PECANS FOR SALE. 
Natives in 8 on bags $2.00. Call 
759-2840. 	 52-XCI 

FOR SALE: CEMETERY MON-
uments, all sizes. Reasonably priced 
See J.P. Flusche or phone 759-2205 
or 759-2203. 1-xc 

FOR RENT 
NICE TWO BEDROOM HOUSE 
for rent on Maple Street. 759-2233 
or 759-4227. 	 3•2C1 

MOBILEHOME FOR RENT, 2 
bedroom, fully furnished, a block 

from school on N. Walnut. PH. 
759-2938, Jerome Pagel. vxv 

se-sin 

With Salad bar and Baked Potato or French Fries 

Friday....Alaskan King Crab 

Rohmer's Restaurant 
Emil and Agnes Rohmer, Muenster 

r• m 	ht,, 	11 omh1 &Sat 

WANTED 
WANT TO BUY: SADDLES, 
bridles, halters. Home 668-7989. 
Office 665-0368. Ask for Jim 
Studer. I-%ca 

WANTED: NURSES AID AND A 
cook at St. Richards Villa. Apply in 
person or call 759-2219. 	5I-XC I 

PART-TIME WAITRESS WANT-
ed at The Center. Must be 18 years 
old. 759-2910. 21-5c 

WANTED: PART-TIME CLEAN-
up person, preferably high school 
boy, 2-3 hrs. weekdays, Saturday, 
all day. Apply in person to H&W 
Meat Co 3 , XCI 

Permanent and Full Time 

HELP WANTED 
Russell Newman Mfg. Co. 

Saint Jo, Texas 

Apply Monday through Edda) 
8:3010 2:30 p.m. 

HELP WANTED 
We need experienced help for immediate em-

ployment in the best equipped factory in the 

North Texas area 

Paid Holidays, Paid Vacations 
Hospitalization, Profit Sharing 

JR. ELITE 
Dress Manufacturing Co. 

120 N. Sycamore, Muenster 

NOTICE 

NOTICE! 
We will be CLOSED 

Friday, December 25 
and 

Friday, January 1 

Gainesville Livestock Market, Inc. 
Cecil Ward - 665-3167 - Milton Ward 

1920 Refinery Rd. - Ph. 665-4367 - P.O. Box 1055 

Gainesville, Texas 	 .281 

HAMRIC'S & THE CHARM SHOP 
Will be Open til 8 Every Wednesday 

Night until Christmas 
Main St. Muenster 

Pre-Christmas Sale 
_„_ 	Poinsettas, Christmas Cactus, 

--fi- 	Kalanchoes, Mums S _ 
41,74)  ‘. 	Norfolk Pines also... 

-IN   TO
a % 	Blue Eldarica Pines 

ready to plant. 

THE GREENHOUSE 
1 Mile West of Moss Lake Road on Hwy. 82 

East of Poly Pipe Industries, Gainesville, 668-6239 

Open Monday thru Saturday 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. 320 , 

Take AD-vantage... 
Shop the Want Ads! 

Wednesc=m1t 

SHRIMP 
NIGHT 

Big Catch - 1 lb. 
$795 

Half Catch 1/2 lb. .. $450 

MISCELLANEOUS 
CREDIT PROBLEMS' 

Get Master card or Visa--No credit 
check, Guaranteed Free details; 
Send SASE to HOC, Box 280570; 
Dallas, TX 75228 (clip and save 
ad). 	 2-0C I 

OUR PRICES ARE IRRES-
istible. Come by and save. Discount 

Pharmacy, Muenster ami 

FOR SALE 

We sell and install 
propane tanks and 

equipment '"' 

SCHILLING 
Propane Service 

759-2505 P.O. Box 532 
Muenster, Texas 76252 

VEU 
Subscription 

TV 

Installation for $29.95. 
First month service 
free. 14 Element An-
tenna $15.00, two stage 
Pre-amp $25.00 (as 
necessary). 665-0994 

Modern Floors 

& Fabrics 

The on. place shopping cantor 

for ham decorating rondo 

Carpet-Vinyl-Tile 

Carpet Cleaning-Custom 

Window Trartrnant.Wellpaper 

Ceiling Fanalight Fixtures 

Clocks 

FabriesPetaant Notions 

206 I Main Mooneter. 759 2848 

Ford 
Tractors 
and Equipment 
Full Parts & Service 

4e* 
Gainesville 	Tractors 

Ford Tractor 
Equipment 

W Hwy 82 

565 6741 	 0 nEll 

..,, 664 :  i 

Our Preminum 

Door Opener 

Cut '49t 0  Was $194.99 

'15V * 
HP garage opener with 2 

rnnsmitterS 

Prices are catalog; shipping, 
delivery and Installation are 
extra. Sears has a credit plan 

to suit most every need 

- This item not on display 
out we will gladly take orders 

rr 
759-2550 

Mac roerchsodier nr.ulr , 
 for ruck up .,thin e foo 

Sears I 2 Pr 

SEARS. ROEBUCK AND t0 

Gainesville 

STEVENS' 
FLOOR COVERING 

Gainesville's Volume Dealer 

6.10SW. erasevrey Over 50 Color Brands of Floor Covering. 

0alnowv111. 

Export Stoon Clowning 

Call Jan Cain 
For Mary Kay 

Cosmetics 

and Re-orders 

Free Delivery 

and Facials 

759-4408 „ s „, 

WRANGLERS 
Shoes - Boots 

Work Dress • Western 

Nocona Boots 

J.R. Hocker 
Men's 8 Boys' Store 

207 N. Commerce, Gainesville 
14151 

FOR SALE: POOL TABLES, ALL 
sizes. Contact Tom or Jerry, 759-
4146 or 7157. 

PICK PECANS ON PERCEN-
tage. Lots of pecans. Special rates 
for large groups. Will flail and pile 
them. 759-4215, day; 759-4215 or 
2800 after 6 p.m. 2.2CI 

REGISTERED 3 YEAR OLD 
Brangus bull for sale. Call after 4 
p m. 759-2711 	 3-2CI 

BLDG. MATERIALS 

FOR SALE: GLASS SHOWER 
Doors, tub enclosures, mirrors in 

all sizes. Installation available. 

Contact Ted Henschel& 759-4280. 
Muenster. rezzt 

GLASS: PLATE, WINDOW, 
automobile, furniture tops, mirrors 
Complete glass service. We handle 
Insurance claims. Gainesville Glass 
Shop, 665-3321,311 N. Chestnut. 

17-XCI 

HOLLYWOOD GARAGE DOG-
. residential and commercial . 

Muenster Building Center. sxv 

Roofing - Paneling 
in stock 

illuensur 
Building Center. 

7592232 

Storm Windows 

Storm Doors 

Weatherstripping 

Insulation 
Muenster 

Building Center, Inc. 
41111 

STORM WINDOWS 
Made in Our Factory 

All types of 
glass repair. 

FREE Estimates 

Energy Efficient 
Home Products 

503 Summit, Ave 

Gainesville. 817-665.9738 
36-0131 

G & H Backh. 

& Dump Truck Service 
Herman Crewing. 

Bernard Hesse 

Sewer Systems 
Oil Field & Industrial Work 

Ph. 759-4130 or 759-4304 
Mobil Ph. 759-4812 

Specializing in 

Mechanic Work 

for farm machinery 

& equipment 

Melvin Voth 
668-7318 

a-mat 

DON'T BE 
STUCK-UP 

on Vi allpaper. 

I will hang wallpaper in new 

homes or remodeled. Call Rita 
Russell, 759-4155 slier 7 p.m.. 

21 xbr 

Septic Tank and 

Grease Trap cleaning 
Allen I rubenbdo, 

Melvin (Babel Schilling 

7594522 759.4158 

PLUMBING 
Installation & Repair 

Residential & Commerical 
FIXTURES, SUPPLIES 
McDonald Water Pumps 

Robert Russell Plumbing 
759-4155 
Muenster  

Dozer Service 
Call or See 

Frank Hess 
759-4249 22 xe, 

FOR RENT: MOTOR HOME, 
sleeps six, loaded with features. 
call 759-4366 or 759-2716. 	It k ,  

1, 2, and 3 BEDROOM APPAR I - 
ments and houses. Rent based on 
income to eligible elderly, han-
dicapped, and low income families. 
Housing Authority of the City of 
Gainesville. 817-665-1747. Specially 
designed units for handicapped 
available. Equal opportunity 
housing 817-665-1747. 

EqualOpporiuno, 

Housing 
/are) 

NOW LEASING 
U-Store and Lock 

Mini Storage 

759-4212 
514 E. 1st St., Muerister 

REAL ESTATE 
NEW HOMES 2, 3, AND 4 
bedrooms. Prices $35,000 to 

75,000. 95 percent financing avail-

ble. Shag carpet, fireplace, ash ea-

inet s. Frazier & Spindle Constr.- 

t 	Co.. 665-5343, 1209 N. Grand 

Gainesville. 	 age 

DON'T BELIEVE ALL YOU 
ear about how high interest is. We 
aye 3 different types of loans for 
ew houses and all with lower in-

terest. Some are adjusted according 
to income and size of family. Call 

r come by for more information. 
Town & Country Real Estate 665-
2875. 5I-XC2 

FOR SALE: 219 HILLCRIEST. 3 
edroom brick. All electric, 11/2 

baths; half acre size lot. Call 759-
4501 after 4 p.m. szxct 

BY OWNER: FOUR ROOM 
house, bap, storm cellar, detached 
wage, 2 garden spots, fenced. 100' 
300' lot. Marysville. For more in-

formation .11817-232-1303. 5.C2P 

FOR SALE 
Cleaning and 

Pressing 
Equipment 

& Building 
also 50 ft of land 

Nick Miller 
'594422 	 as r 

NOTICE 
CITATION BY PUBLICATION 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
TO: John Robert Carlin, 

Respondent: 
GREETINGS: 

YOU ARE HEREBY COM-
MANDED to appear and answer 
before the Honorable District 
Court, Cooke County, Texas, at 
the Courthouse of said County in 
Gainesville, Texas, at or before 10 
o'clock a.m. of the Monday next 
after the expiration of 20 days from 
the date of service of this citation, 
then and there to answer the 
petition of Jo Any Hall, Petitioner, 
filed in said Court on the 28th day 
of May, 1981, against John Robert 
Carlin, Respondent, and said suit 
being numbered 81-223 on the 
docket of said Court, and entitled 
"In The Interest of John Robert 
Carlin, Jr., a Child", the nature of 
which suit is a request to Terminate 
the parent-child relationship bet-
ween John Robert Carlin and the 
child and the petitioners adopt said 
child. 
Said child was born the 5th day of 
February, 1980, in Morehead City, 
North Carolina. 

The Court has authority in this 
suit to enter any judgment or decree 
in the child's interest which will be 
binding upon you, including the 
termination of the parent-child 
relationship and the appointment 
of a conservator with authority to 
consent to the child's adoption. 

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the date of 
its issuance, it shall be returned un• 
served. 

The officer executing this writ 
shall promptly serve the same ac-
cording to requirements of law, and 
the mandates hereof, and make dare 
return as the law directs. 

Issued and given under my hand 
and the seal of Said Court at 
Gainesville, Texas, this the I 01 11 dam 
of December, 1981. 
Bobbie Calhoun, Clerk. 
District Court, 
Cooke County, Texas. 
By Joy Huddleston, Deputy. su I 
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IN STOCK 

Electrical - Plumbing 
Paneling - Roofing 

Hardware - Water Pumps 
Heating - Air-conditioning 
We can recommend an installer 

Muenster Building Center, Inc. 
Muenster. Tex 759-2232 

Call 

Dan Luke 
759-2522 

FOR 

FINA GAS 
FINA OIL '"' 

Y N 

I 759 -4311 or 759-4351 	noon Wednesday to place class' 
Or • 

,AIDS 



TEXAS FARM BUREAU 
OFFICIAL INEPAESERSHIP CA 

DOS 	FIES THAT 

JOHN 0. FARs52... 
ROUTKx-1—J I 4241,>1. 
FARMVM_l_El 'lEXr76 0 

VVSS A 	Of 

This Card 
Entitles You to 
Purchase 
SAFEMARK .  
tires and battmies. Another service-

to-member program offering a quality 

product at low cost. 

FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION, CONTACT, 

Fuhrmann Bros. Garage 
Myra, Texas 

-BE SURE TO HAVE YOUR MEMBERSHIP 
1-XS' 

•Tradernark Registered by 

Farm Bureau 

CARD WITH YOU" 

Earn a $700 bonus on 
any new 40- to 80- hp 

40 Series John Deere Tractor 
now through January 

Buy a new 40-hp 2040, 50-hp 2240, 60-hp 2440. 
70-hp 2640 or 80-hp 2940 before the end of January 
You'll earn a $700 bonus in John Deere money you 
can apply to the purchase price or spend for goods 
or service at our store. The money bonus will be 
mailed to you after we deliver the tractor. 

There's more. Use the new variable-rate John 
Deere finance plan and no finance charges will ac-
crue on your new tractor and new implements 
bought with it until June 1, 1982. Or lease your new 
tractor and receive a 10 percent discount on an 
lease payments. 

And still more. The 2940 Tractor can now be or-
dered with Sound-Gard' body option for real com-
fort and convenience. On all models get the proven 
performance of a John Deere tractor with outstand-
ing lugging ability, tough drive-train and a lot of 
extras, such as closed-center hydraulics, as stand-
ard equipment. 

Don't miss out on our best new tractor deal plus 
the John Deere money bonus 

MITCHELL & 
CLOWER, INC. 

East Hwy. 82, Gainesville 

817-665-0789, 817-665-3921 

Rick Royal Glen E. Fisk Ron Combest 
gency Nlanager 	 Agent 

665-1763 	 665.1107 	 665.0537 

WHEN YOU NEED INSURANCE SERVICE FOR 

YOUR...HOME, RANCH, FARM, AUTO, CROPS, LIFE 

Think of Low Net Cost with Service 

Ummus

Call for 

B Terns Farm Bureau 	Free Estimate 

Insurance Companies 665-1763 
111101 

Don't let the icy streets and highways surprise 
you with a skid and a crash. Let FMW Agency 
review your auto insurance to be sure it meets 
the high cost of repairs and injury awards that 
may run to $100,000 or more. 

F MW 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

"Surprise 

me!" 

For FREE Classified Ads call in our next shopper 

Call 759-4311 

111 
Ascr 

h'ffi vh„, 
'. 501 0140, 
On 10 H•N 

me 

■ 

D 
ate err 

Ins 

ring 

•  
D 
t5 

et, Inc. 

:1 1" 
sday 

4141 

:actus, 
15s 

0 

let 	2 

USE A 
■ .82 
668_621 9  

5C m 

15' 
PRICE 

ROLLBACK 
IN DECEMBER 

 

Plus Waiver or 13.9% APR Financing 

Forget any reasons you may have for not 
buying a new farm utility tractor right now 
Massey-Ferguson has rolled back prices to 
us in December by 15%... on every new 34 to 
81 PTO hp tractor on our lot. This means 
some of the biggest savings we've ever been 
able to offer_. to youl 

Don't wait. Come in and buy now, because 
these savings apply only to new equipment 
purchased in December — just in time for 
year-end tax credits. too 

Choice of financing 
If you buy now and qualify for financing 
through Massey-Ferguson, we'll make your 
deal even sweeter with a waiver of finance 

charges 'til season of use, or 13.9% annual 
percentage rate financing for two years. It s 
your choice See us now for all the details. 

Waiver dates: 
Tractors, implements, 

industrial machines 	 March 1, 1982 
Hay tools  	 May 1. 1982 
Grain combines 	 August 1, 1982 
Corn bean combines 	September 1, 1982 

Used equipment savings too. 
Waiver of finance charges and 13.9% financing 
options are also available to qualified buyers 
through MF on used machinery and equip-
ment on our lot . 

Hurry! These price rollback savings 
are good only during December 1981. 

MF 
Massey Ferguson 

Now more than ever, Massey makes sense. 

Merry Christmas 
from all of us at 

S&W Tractor Co. 
Interstate 35 at Hwy. 82, Gainesville 

THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE - DECEMBER 18, 1981 - PACE 13 

WINTERIZE 
INSULATION 

By John R. Pipes 
Civil Engineer 

Recent 	high-frequency 
rains 	caused 	extensive 
damage to farmland in the 
Upper-Elm-Red Soil and 

Much terracing still needed 

your 
home 
with 

Water 	Conservation 
District. Many fields had 
been prepared for sowing 
small grain and had no cover 
on the land. Flood water 
removed several inches of 
topsoil. In some fields the 
soil at depth of last plowing 
was removed and washed 
down stream. In fields with 
terraces that had been main-
tained, much less soil was 
removed by the rains. 

Even though farmers have 
been building terraces for 
many years, much farmland 
still remains to be terraced. 
Actions through nature can 
generally replenish soil 
losses caused by sheet 
erosion of four to six tons 
per acre based on depth of 
existing soil. Four to six tons 
per acre is approximately the 
tickness of a dime. A bot-
tomland field of clay soils 

Upper Elm-Red 
"Quail hunting season is 

now in progress but how 
many people are planning 
for next season? The next 
few months are important to 
the coming years' crop of 
quail," according to Ed 
Schwille, Biologist for the 
Soil Conservation Service. 

Birds for this year are 
already on-the-ground and 
ample numbers exist 
statewide. What about the 
1982 quail crop? Normally,  

that has been plowed only 
four inches deep and the 
total 4-inch plow depth 
removed would equal a loss 
of approximately 463 tons 
per acre. Soil weights will 
vary from 85 pounds per 
cubic foot for a clay soil to 
100 pounds per cubic foot 
for a sandy soil. 

If you have cropland with 
slopes greater than one per-
cent, you may need to 
terrace. Contact your local 
Soil Conservation Service 
office and request one of the 
trained technicians to assist 
you in developing a plan to 
locate waterways and a 
parallel terrace system for 
your farm. Besides stopping 
the movement of that good 
topsoil, you will notice an 
increase 	in 	production 
because 	of 	increased 
moisture intake and in-
creased fertility. 

SWCD news 
birds will be found where 
their habitat is managed to 
produce a new crop. What 
makes good quail habitat 
and where to start? This 
question is often asked of 
Schwille. "Food and cover 
is generally the answer given 
for habitat but management 
or taking care of the food 
and cover is what it is all 
about," Schwille says. 

Normally the quail food 
supply is low in late winter 
and late summer. Quail do 
feed on insects and green 
plants but their diet is 
mainly any small hard seed 
they can swallow. Many 
plants called weeds by some 
people provide most of the 
food supply. Light disking 
during January through 
March will encourage weed 
growth for summer 
produced seed. Kleingrass, 
switchgrass, bahiagrass and 
many legumes are good 
sources of food. A year-long 
and varied supply of hard 
seed from grasses, forbs or 
weeds and some woody 
plants is needed to sustain a 
good bird population. 

A common mistaken 
belief is that if a pasture 
supports good forage for 
livestock it must be equally 
suited for quail. "Quail nest 
mainly in the previous years' 
standing grass cover. This is 
usually grass taller than 12 
inches and has been protec-
ted from continuous 
livestock grazing, mowing 
or shredding or other 
ground disturbances. 
Leaving briars and shrubs in 
fence rows make excellent 
travel ways and loafing 
cover. Half cutting mesquite 
or other hardwoods that 
have one inch or less stems 
increase available cover. 
Fenced corners or odd areas 
made unaccessible are ideal 
locations when quail begin 
to nest in late spring," 
stated Schwille. 

Gary Rainwater, District 
Conservationist with the 
Soil Conservation Service 
says, "Technical assistance 
on the management of quail 
habitat is available at our 
office in Muenster." 

We'll measure 

your house 

FREE! 
Muenster Building Center, Inc. 

421 N. Main, 7592232 	AIM 



-that ractiq.e ClAritottria62koppg .e,a4 

for is e r: 
Gemiresse, Jontue, Charlie, 

Toujours Moi, Chantilly, 

Chanel No. 5, No. 19, No. 22, 

Nina Ricci, Norell, Clara, 

White Shoulders & Cerissa 

fo r 
Matchabelli, Grey Flannel, 

Lenel, Pierre Cardin, 

Chaz, Sandalwood 

Billfolds by Justin and Prince Gardner, 

Norelco & Remmington razors 

Watt's Brothers 
Pharmacy 

Downtown Gainesville 	 6654335 7•2131 

First Texas 
has the right plan 

to help you 
beat the fICrs. 

H--- 

DAILY-RATE 
REPURCHASE 
AGREEMENT 

FIXED-RATE 
REPURCHASE 
AGREEMENT 

26-WEEK 
MONEY 

MARKET 
CERTIFICATE 

1 	2 1/2-YEAR 
MONEY 

MARKET 
CERTIFICATE 

TAX-FREE 
CERTIFICATE** 

RATE 11.7 5% 10.30% 11.845% 12.95% 8.34% 
RATE EFFECTIVE ON: Dec. 1 5, 1981 Dec. 15, 1981 Dec. 15-21,'81 	Dec. 8 -Dec.21 Nov.2 9—Dec.26 

MINIMUM DEPOSIT $2,000 $2,000 $10,000 	$100 $500 
RATE FIXED FOR: One Day 89 Days 26 Weeks 2'i2 Years 1 Year 

BROKERAGE FEE/ 
SERVICE CHARGE No No No No No 

TELEPHONE 
RENEWAL Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes 

STATEMENT 
MAILED Month-end At Maturity Quarterly Quarterly Quarterly 

PENALTY FOR EARLY 
WITHDRAWAL No Yes Yes Yes Yes 

INSURED No No FSLIC FSLIC FSLIC 

Whatever your financial needs, First Texas Savings Association has the 

right plan to help you beat the 80's. 
We offer a variety of plans, designed to meet every financial need. It's this kind of 

financial flexibility plus our high rates, that make First Texas plans the most productive 

way to increase your money. 
Look at the chart and compare our different plans. Then, call or stop 

by any of our over 70 offices today. You'll get expert advice on which plan best serves 

your personal needs. 
At First Texas, we can help you beat the 80's, no matter what your needs. 

Savings Association 

We have ways to beat 
the 80's. 

Denison Office • 630 W Main St. • 463-3702 
Gainesville Office • 101 E. Broadway • 665-3484 
Muenster Office • 510 E Division St. • 759-2283 
Sherman Office • 400 N. Travis St. • 893-8191 

”Tax-free Certificate—Yield is based on interest paid at maturity. 
Government regulations require: Tax exemption will be lost if account 
is closed before one year or used as collateral for a loan. Maximum 
lifetime tax exemption is $1,000 single. $2,000 interest for a joint 

return. Withdrawing your interest monthly or quarterly will result in 
lower annual interest than if the interest were left to maturity. 
Repurchase Agreements—Money Maker Security is a secured 
debt of First Texas collateralized by Government Securities. 

t 1981 First Texas Savings Association 
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54 RODNEY'S 

IT HAPPEN 77D 
45 " 

Sacred 	1-1 	 ,h 
opens fund for new church. 
Tom Watson, 39, of Myra 
dies of pneumonia. Mr. 
John Strum, 77, dies at Lin-
dsay. J.W. Meurer is 
seriously ill following 
collapse at bank desk after 
refusing to take off from 
work from attack of flu. 
C.J. Kaiser is seriously ill 
with pneumonia. Mrs. 
Rosina Klement, 84, breaks 
hip in fall. Joe Cooke's jaw 
is broken by horse's kick. 
Klough Edelen dies of in-
juries in Oklahoma oil field 
explosion. Bill Fink of the 
Enterprise moves his family 
here from Kerrville. Sumacs 
accept invitation to 
Ringgold basketball tour-
nament. 

40 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 12, 1941 

Muenster 	anxiously 
follows reports of Japanese 
conflict...several 	youths 
from here are believed 
located in war zone...Ensign 
Robert Weinzapfel dive 
bomber pilot on aircraft 
Lexington, is stationed at 
Peart Harbor, scene of last 
Sunday's Jap assault. Ray 
Tempel, 19 follows father's 
precedent; is first to enlist 
since the declaration of war. 
Ludwig 	Zimmerer 	of 
LaFeria dies. Railroad 
crossing crash is fatal to 
Marvin Davidson, 24, of 
Myra. Eddie Mages, Harry 
Fisher, Alois Rohmer, 
Adolph Schumacher and 
Alphonse Schmitz enter 
selective service. Thirty-one 
children are in this year's 
First Communion class. The 
home of Annie and Mary 
Baker is being remodeled. 

35 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 13, 1946 

Edward "Buddy" Fette, 
43, dies suddenly of heart 
failure. Community clothing 
drive for war relief totals 
1097 pounds. Sacred Heart 
Alumni plans holiday dinner 
dance. Mrs. Bob Knabe 
breaks left ankle in fall. 
Kathy Voth has minor 
surgery. Arnie Swirczynski 
joins Lou Wolf in barber 
shop. Community's annual 
turkey market hits new low 
with only 400 birds. Lena 
Kleiss returns from a visit in 
Houston. Three inches of 
rain falls in three days. 
Meinrad Stoffels is 
promoted to sergeant in 
Tokyo. Elsie Sanches of 
Wichita, Kansas, fiancee of 
Gene Hoedebeck, is visiting 
the family here. The John 
Hoberers Jr. celebrate their 
silver wedding anniversary 
at Lindsay. 

30 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 14, 1951 

City asks for drilling bids 
on new water well. Three of 
four busses on parochial 
school routes are in service. 
Parish gives $537 to Dallas 
orphanage in annual collec- 
tion. J.M. Weinzapfel at- 
tends credit school at A&M. 
J.J. Haverkamp and Alex 
Lutkenhaus are recovering 
from surgery. Sacred Heart 
Press Clubbers attend Den- 

ton con, ention. Local far- 
rrers n.ke tour of Texas 

• 	Foundation at 
The 	Eugene 

its and family arc 
ba,k Irom a vacation visit in 
Wisconson. Boy Scouts pass 
cooking tests on Sunday 
outing. New arrivals: Lola 
for the Joe Voths and Terry 
Ann for the Russell Herbs. 
SH Sodality observes 
patronal feat with attendan-
ce at Mass, reception of 14 
new members and Com-
munion breakfast. 

25 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 14, 1956 

Cold, wet weather puts 
handicap on Christmas 
parade and reduces atten-
dance. Rain measures half 
inch to bring year's total to 
date to 16.04 inches. Muen-
ster and Saint Jo bands 
work on joint concert. 
Robert K. Maupin, state 
VFW leader and son-in-law 
of Mr. and Mrs. B.G. 
Lyons, dies. Fire Depar-
tment elects Herbie Herr 
chief. Infant son of the Ed-
die Fettes dies at Kermit. 
Brownie troop will have 
Christmas program and 
caroling. Franciscan Third 
Order admits four new 
members. Girl Scouts make 
Christmas gifts for their 
mothers. Max Harrell, who 
survived historic brain 
surgery, is making progress 
in recovery. Rex Anderson 
resigns as assistant county 
agent to take vocational ag 
teaching job at Forestburg. 
Mrs. Frank Yosten's father, 
Julius Filer, 84, dies at 
Tours. 

20 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 15, 1961 

Little interest is seen in 
Saturday's election to elect 
successors to Congressman 
Frank Ikard and Represen-
tative Tony Korioth. 
Season's worst ice storm 
brings 12 degree tem-
perature. County men join 
state wide effort for animal 
health in screw-worm 
program. Gene Hoedebeck 
is elected new fire chief. 
Completion nears on detain 
plan for local hospital. 
Larry Hofbauer takes on 
defense project as missile 
technician in New York. 
Muenster teams win two 
trophies in basketball tour-
nament; SH girls are runner-
ups and MHS boys win con-
solation. A.J. Phillips is new 
man for Lone Star Gas Co. 
in this area. Leonard Har-
tman is recovering from 
major surgery. Kenny Fette 
is transferred to Guam. Lin-
dsay yougsters and Craft 
Club leaders take Christmas 
gifts to children at State 
School in Denton. CDA 
meeting Friday will feature 
business and annual Yule 
party. New arrivals: girls for 
Messrs. and Mmes. Jim 
Hermes, Leroy Sch-
midlkofer and Thomas 
Felderhoff . 

15 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 16, 1966 

Muenster Public School 
Board members at their 
December 	meeting 
acknowledged they are 
facing a financial emergency 
that needs an early solution• 
they are out of money and  

must soon find a way to get 
some. The Rev. Larry 
Taylor is new pastor of 
Muenster Baptist Church. 
Firemen relect Alvin Har-
tman chief. Jaycees will 
sponsor Santa's visit here 
Saturday. SHH students 
compete in Denton speech 
tournament. CDA members 
cheer shut-ins with gifts. 
Garden Club has cookie 
bake for rest home and 
hospital patients. SH 
primary department presen-
ts Christmas play. Concert 
and Christmas parties crowd 
school calendar before 
holiday recess. SH Alumni 
Association re-elects Ervin 

Henscheid president. Mr 
and Mrs. Ike Fulton will 
celebrate golden wedding 
anniversary Sunday. Santa 
parties set for KC and VFW 
Auxiliary children. Mrs. 
John Felderhoff has 
surgery. New arrivals: a boy 
for the Joe Schmidlkofers; 
girls for the Felix Pelzels and 
Tommy Gressetts. 

10 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 17, 1971 

Noel display dominates 
sky over Muenster from 
water tower. SH 4-Hers are 
county champion Share-the-
Fun, will go to the district. 

Garden Club has program 
of color Christmas slides. 
CCJC host dairyman's an-
nual dinner meeting. 
Thomas Mosman receives 
Army commendation 
Medal. Bloodmobile due 
here Wed. 

5 YEARS AGO 
Dec. 17, 1976 

SH team are No. I in 
Plano speech tournament. 
New kindergarten building 
planned at Public School. 
Underwood, 	Freeman 
choosen new county judge 
and attorney. Tigers selected 
for 8 places on TCIL all- 
district. Hornets get 21 
positions in Dream team. 

Elm-Red to sponsor Essay 
Contest on Soil Conser-
vation. Chamber of Com-
merce meeting discussed im-
provements for parade and 
coming events. Ben Otto, 
84, Gainesville buried here. 

  

Wimmer 
Diesel 

Service 
Truck and 

Tractor Repairs 

East Hwy. 82 
759-2560— 

  

  

Muenster 

Pharmacy 
Medical Center 

Building 
817.759-2833 

    

1 9995  ki 

YEARS AGO 

has moved to Gainesville just east of the 
shopping mall in the big, brown building 
on the "Y" 
We will appreciate your business and we 
will make it worth your drive. 

Jim Metzler 
Paint & Body Shop 

Ph 6657717, 1425 N. Grand 
Gainesville, Tx. 7624.0 

YOUR LAST CHANCE TO PUT ON THE RITZ FOR CHRISTMAS 95  

All ceiling fans are not alike. The Ritz is special. It's the finest ceiling 
fan made. And its the only one that reverses with a pull! That means 
you can use the Ritz All Year long. 
In reverse, it circulates warm air evenly throughout the room, helping 
stay comfortable at a lower thermostat setting. So you save energy in 
your home and money on your utility bills. 

HOMEFINISHINGS 
Gainesville 665-4101 

 R1A 
2003 E. Hwy. 82  



Keepsake Pak 
Preserves and 

Protects 

the original beauty 

of your wedding 

gown or other 
treasures. 

Miller 
Cleaners 

6 • Month Money Market Certificate 
510,000 Minimum 

Current Annual Rate 

11.845% 
Effective December 1 5 thru December 21 

Federal regulations prohibit compounding of interest 
on 6- Month Money Certificate 

FIRST SAVING'S 

N.O.W.•• 
CHECKING ACCOUNT 

*No Service Charge 
Pays 51/4 Interest Compounded Daily 
Free Checking to All Senior Citizens 

First Savings Will 
Safeguard Your Cancelled Checks 

• [Wed on 	 MOO rolelmon dope. I. pe• end • MOO nOnlinton ..ore 

If you can t come see us, 
We'll come to see you! 	Irol 

• 

 S 
AND LOAN ASSOCIATION 

OF BOWIE, TEXAS 

1020 N. Grand 
Gainesville, Texas 

OFFICE: 665-0316 
665-0472 

FIRST 

Keep More 

1982 Tax Dollars 

For Yourself 
With an IRA (Individual Retirement Account) you can 

contribute up to $2,000 of your income into a high interest 
earning retirement account. This actually lowers your 
taxable income every year by the amount you contribute. 
And, the yearly amount you invest plus the interest you earn 
is tax-free until you retire. 

Come by our office for complete details. 

MAO Muenster 
State Bank 

759-2257 	Member FDIC 

 

"Our Interest is in our Community." 

50.101 

CHILDS 
DISCOUNT CARPET & 

VINYL SUPERMART 

Over 5000 rolls 
of carpet and vinyl 

in stock 

1/2  PRICE 
AND 
LESS 

805 N. Interstate 35, Gainesville, 665.7330 

(Old K's-Thrift Location) 

Locations also In Sherman and Denison 
39 , 502 

Public Notice 
Texas Power & Light Company, in accordance 

with the rules of the Public Utility Commission of 
Texas, hereby gives notice of intent to amend its 
fuel cost factor tariff schedule to establish a pro-
cedure for regulatory approval of certain fuel 
related expenses prior to those expenses being 
included in the fuel cost factor portion of monthly 
bills for electric service. This revision will be effec-
tive in areas served by the company on the 13th 
day of January, 1982, or as soon thereafter as 
permitted by law. 

This revision constitutes an administrative 
change and is not expected to increase or de-
crease the rates or the revenues of the company. 

A copy of this revision is on file with the Public 
Utility Commission at Austin, Texas. and with 
each affected municipality. Copies are also avail-
able for inspection in each of the company's busi-
ness offices. 

II-1XAS POWLR & LIGHT COMPANY 
A tan-paying. inveslor-ownecl eleCtriC minty 

4401 

Reprocessing nuclear fuel saves energy . 

let's quit 
wasting  it. 

We Americans have a well-earned reputation for finish-

ing whatever we begin. Rut today there's unfinished busi-
ness delaying Our progress toward energy independencee. 
We don't yet have a national policy for reprocessing nu-

clear fuel and storing nuclear waste. 
When the used fuel is removed from nuclear power 

plants, less than three percent of the volume is waste. The 
remainder makes substantial amounts of fuel available fu r 

future Mei, after the wastes are removed in a reprocessing 

plant. A large commercial reprocessing plant has been 
successfully operating in France since 1976. In America 
this same process can help us extend our supplies and ease 
the problems of waste disposal by making it possible to 

,tore only the wastes. 
We know hiw to reprocess the fuel and how to store 

wastes safely. When to start reprocessing, and where to 
store the wastes, are decisions the Federal Government 
responsible for. And they still haven't been made. 

At your electric company, we believe the decisions 
should be made. And we believe that the user, of the 
reprocessing and storage facilities should bear their ex-

pense. We also believe there's an urgent need to make 
decisions now — so that we can plan for the future, and 
you can ise assured of a dependable supply of electricity at 

a reasonable cost. 

I 
Tal Livingston, 89, of Myra dies Sacred Heart Youth Ministry notes 
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Phone 759-4311 to 
report news items, or 
send notes to Box 190, 
Muenster. 

Muenster 

Funeral 	service 	for 
Talmadge Livingston, 89, of 
Myra was held Wednesday 
morning at 10:30 in the Ver-
Me Keel Funeral Home with 
the Reverend Pat Cummins 
and Buster Latham of-
ficiating. 

Burial was in Reed 

Cemetery directed by Keel 
Funeral Home and 
pallbearers were grandsons: 
Jody Greg, Robert 
Livingston, Charles Cum-
mins, Gene Cummins, 
David Cummins, Keith 
Livingston and Marty 
Livingston. 

Tal Livingston died Sun-
day at his home in Myra. 

He was born October 2, 
1892 at Taylorsville, N.C. a 
son of Lance and Marinda 
Livingston. He married 
Dora King and lived most of 
his life in Myra. He was a 
Baptist and a cattle trader. 

Survivors include one son, 
C.L. Livingston of Myra; 
one daughter, Mrs. Betty 
King of Groom; two 
brothers, Lee Livingston of 
Myra and Bob Livingston of 
Gainesville; 	II 	gran- 
dchildren, 	14 	great- 
grandchildren, and one 
great-great-grandchild . 

Programs announced 
H2O 

H2O spiritual committee 
has announced the post-
ponement of the "Super 
Soul Time" scheduled for 
Sunday, December 20. The 
committee plans to 
reschedule the event at a 
later date. 

TIA 
TIA service committee 

has announced plans to 
decorate Sacred Heart 
Church for the Christmas 
holidays. The TIA youth 
members are asked to meet 
in Church at 1 p.m. to begin 
decorating. All TIA mem-
bers are asked to help with 
the decorating. 

Caroling 
Approximately 110 H2O 

members went Christmas 
caroling last Friday night. 
The group left the com- 
munity center parking lot in 
three haytrailers and went 
caroling around town until 
approximately 8:30 p.m. 
when they returned to the 
community 	center 	for 
refreshments. They were 
served summer sausage, 

MHS Student Council 
The MHS Student Coun-

cil, in its December 2 
business meeting held in the 
library, made plans for 
Christmas observances and 
events, helped in decorating 
the hall bulletin boards for 
the Christmas season. Also 
included were discussions of 
next spring's Public School 
Week, and a high school 
field day later in the year. 

Joshua Matthew Wilde, 
infant son of Dan and Karen 
Wilde, was baptized in 
Sacred Heart Church by 
Father Denis Soerries on 
November 22, 1981. 

The baptismal sponsors 
are Greg and Shirley Wilde, 
an uncle and aunt. 

Joshua wore a white satin 
baptismal suit, a special gift 
from his great aunt, Mrs. 
Laurie Bezner of Stephen-
ville. 

The baptismal ceremony 
was part of a special day 
that included the first 
Communion of Joshua's 
older brother and sister, 
Scott and Melanie. 

Attending the baptism 
were the grandparents Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Wilde and 
Mr. and Mrs. Forrest Mc-
Michael; and the great-
grandmother, Mrs. Joe 
Wilde; also David Mc-
Michael, Tina Wilde, Chris 
and Jan Cain with Christin 
and Cory; Greg and Shirley 
Wilde with Jeffrey; and the 
baby's parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dan Wilde and his 
brother and sister Scott and 
Melanie. 

All attending were also 
guests at the celebration  

cheese, crackers, chips and 
dips, hot chocolate or cold 
drinks by Kathy Vogel, 
Eileen Vogel and Shirley 
Reiter. 

Adults assisting during 
the hayride were John Dave 
and Patsy Fleitman, Harold 
and Betty Jean Bindel, John 
and JoAnn Pagel, Monica 
Hess and Lisa Walterscheid. 
All participants report a 
thoroughly enjoyable time. 

Two Groups 
The 	youth 	ministry 

groups held their monthly 
meetings on Monday, 
December 14 in the Com-
munity Center cafeteria with 
Youth Consultant, Pam 
Alford presiding over the 
meetings. 

All 	committees 	gave 
reports of past and future 
events. Pam asked that each 
committee map out plans 
for events for the next six 
months and be ready to 
submit them at the next 
youth ministry meeting. The 
groups were informed that 
the January meetings will be 
on the afternoon of Satur-
day, January 2 with H2O to 
meet at 3 p.m. and TIA to 

JETS 
The JETS Club met 

Friday November 20 in the 
Math Classroom to elect of-
ficers. Named to serve the 
JETS Club for the next year 
are Jenny Hellman 
president; Jeff Fisher vice 
president; Shelley Zimmerer 
secretary; Dora Sicking 
treasurer; 	and 	Brent 
McElreath reporter. 

dinner and family gathering 
given by the paternal gran-
dparents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray 
Wilde. 

Twins honored on 
1st Communion 
Melanie and Scott Wilde, 

children of Dan and Karen 
Wilde, were honored on 
their First Communion Day 
with a dinner and family 
gathering hosted by their 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Wilde, in their home. 

The honorees enjoyed 
opening gifts and visiting 
with the family. 

Guests were Melanie's 
godparents, Mike and Joni 
Sturm and their children 
Amy and Kimberly; Scott's 
godparents, Chris and Jan 
Cain and their children 
Christin and Cory; also 
Greg, Shirley and Jeffrey 
Wilde; Tina Wilde of Den-
ton; great-grandparents 
Mrs. Joe Wilde and John 
Schmitz; also the maternal 
grandparents Mr. and and 
Mrs. Forrest McMichael of 
Gainesville and an uncle 
David McMichael of 
Garland.  

meet at 4 p.m. It was also 
decided that a 82.00 dues tee 
will be collected during the 
January meetings to defray 
some of the costs of youth 
ministry events. 

H2O service committee 
served cookies and hot 
chocolate to their members 
and TIA recreation commit-
tee served chips, dips, and 
Cokes to their group. 

During the evening a 
small plant was presented to 
Miss Alford on behalf of 
both youth ministry groups 
in honor of her birthday 
which was December 13. 

We Carry 

All Types Of 

Gas Heating 

Stoves 

Also All Types 
Of Unfinished 

Furniture 

Allman's 
Furniture 

1321 N. Grand, Gainesville 

:y 
or 

reat Selection of 
ower and Hand 

Tools! 
Community 
Lumber Co. 

25% OFF  
ON ALL FALL 

MERCHANDISE 

1 RACK 

Y2 of 1/2 price 

665-6111 	101 E. California, Gainesville, 

MHS student notes 

Joshua Wilde is baptized 



ELCOME IT WITH US AT OUR 

New Year's Eve 

Music By 

MIKE OTTS 

KC HALL Dec. 31 9 to 1 a.m. 

LIMIT 	FOR RESERVATIONS 

180 Persons 	736-2327 or 759-4377 

II 

Happy Hour 
8.10 p.m. 

Breakfast 
1:00 

$15.00 per couple 
Sponsored by the Knights of Columbus 

We've Moved! 
to the Corner of 

Main at Weaver 

Glue a Christmas gift 

that will last and be remembered 
throughout the years 

Prints and Custom Framing 

The Frame House 
665 -7401. 315 West Main. Gainesville 

We have 
Wicker 

Furniture, 

too! 

G.E. Microwave Ovens 
Ct 	ALL ON SALE!! 

S 

V 

E 
$100 et:  

on 

Grand 
father 

clocks 

Browse through 

our Brass and 

Porcelain 

Accessory 

Department • 

All Sale Priced! 

Gkkomi>o,tip.'sccklmAt iti 
HESS FURNITURE'S 

PRE-CHRISTMAS 

SALE! 

Save up to 20% on 
Dining Room Furniture 

HESS FURNITURE 
2m02 Ne;IsMaer

i n "We've got your style" • 
TtlytatiltrrN-0;dcYCIKt•fikeiaida"Ot:*, .044414:/t2r  

1201 

See Us for 
Arkansas Grown 

CERTIFIED OR NON•CERTIFIED 

Seed Oats 

Let Us Feed Your 

Cattle This Winter 
with 

PROLIX 
Liquid Protein Supplement 

—35% protein 
...No Labor 
...No Waste 
...Better Calf Crop 

. Economical 

NOW is the time to start 

Shawnee breeder range cubes also 
available at competitive prices 

Muenster Milling Company 
Hours: Mon. thru Fri. 7:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Saturday 7:30 a.m. to noon 

New Year's Eve 

DANCE 
Featurtng Music by 

HRRDTI  M E 
No Coolers Please • BYOB 

For tickets call Gilbert Knabe, 759-2592 
or Don Eckert, 759-2978 alter 5 p.m . 

Absolutely NO Admittance without a ticket 
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8•41• INS•lallity.G•Dup Insurance 

Annullips Per41031PlanS 

Wallace K. 
INGLISH 

Nal 0 ,• Sara, Acrwymne, A•a 

No. VorS LIT. Insumn. Co 

1105 011w 

Gatrosvi••• T. 71240 

Bus (8171065-5863 

On rem 387-7975 

LOST LUGGAGE 
209 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

DPS intensifies efforts to 
fill current vacancies 

Firearms training is given to each student by highly skilled instructors. They learn the 
proper care and handling of the weapon and how to fire with accuracy. Each Trooper 
must qualify on the DPS firing range which is operated similar to a military firing range. 

The Texas Department of 
Public Safety will conduct 
an additional recruit 
training school next year to 
help state trooper vacancies, 
according to DPS Director 
Jim Adams. 

"The department usually 
schedules two of these 
schools at the academy in 
Austin each year," Adams 
said. "Three schools will be 
necessary in 1982 to bring 
the DPS up to its authorized 
strength." 

The DPS director said the 
agency hopes to recruit 268 
new troopers during 1982. 

"We are intensifying our 
statewide effort to attract 
qualified men and women 
who would like to serve in 
one of the finest law enfor-
cement organizations in the 
country," Adams said. 
"DPS troopers are held in 
high esteem by their coun-
terparts in other states." 

The DPS presently has 86 
trooper vacancies within the 
Highway Patrol ranks and 
five trooper vacancies in the 
Driver License Service due 
to promotions, retirements 
and attrition. 

The Forestburg 4-H Club 
enjoyed a Christmas party, 
with games and refreshmen-
ts, during the fourth meeting 
of the current school year. It 
was held in the library with 
17 members attending. 
Refreshments were brought 
by Merle Hudspeth and Cleo 
Lanier. One guest, Leah 
Hudspeth also attended. 
Reporter Krista Shults said 
that everyone had a great 
time. The next meeting will 
be on January 13, 1982. 

Muenster 4-H 
Muenster Community 4- 

Hers brought cookies to 

Schedule of 

n Meetings 
 VFW Auxiliary 

The 	regular 	VFW 
Auxiliary meeting is 
scheduled for Mon. Dec. 21 
at 8 p.m. Members are 
reminded that auxiliary dues 
must be paid within the nex 
week to qualify for cance 
insurance. 

Adams pointed out that 
the 67th State Legislature 
allocated the DPS a total of 
20 additional Highway 
Patrol positions, 10 more 
License and Weight troopers 
and 20 additional narcotics 
investigators over the next 
two years. 

We offer recruits the 
finest training available 
today," Adams said. 
"Preparing a person to con-
fidently face the many law 
enforcement responsibilities 
requires a lot of effort, time, 
support and money." 

In addition to the basic 
traffic 	safety 	respon- 
sibilities, 	DPS 	troopers 
regularly provide assistance 
in criminal investigations 
and disaster-emergency 
situations. 

Trainees live and eat in 
the academy during the 18-
week course. 

Recruits earn a starting 
monthly salary of $1,233. 
Upon graduation, the of-
ficers are paid $1,347 mon-
thly plus allowances for 
uniforms and equipment. 
When a trooper completes a 
year with the department 

their December 8 meeting, 
to take to residents of St. 
Richard's Villa, where they 
sang Christmas carols and 
visited. About 35 members 
attended. Their trip to St. 
Richard's followed the 
regular monthly meeting in 
the Public School cafeteria. 

During the business 
meeting reports were made 
that 17 members have com-
pleted the Foods and 
Nutrition project, and four 
of these competed in the 
County Food Show. 

Most of the club members 
joined the Craft Project. 
Some have completed their 
work and a few are still 
busy. Also some of the 
members are involved with 
the Share the Fun contest, 
being readied for January 
16. 

Plans were made for 
members to attend the 
County 4-H Christmas party 
on December 21, 6 p.m. to 
8:30 p.m., when 4-Hers will 
meet at the Farm Bureau 
Building for a hayride and 
caroling through 
Gainesville. 

Those attending are to 
bring any type of homemade 
seasonal goodies, enough 
for 11/2 portions. 

The next meeting will be 
on January 12, when mem-
bers will work on the Poster 
contest. 

Electrical 
Contracting 

Fixtures 
Supplies 

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 

Installations. Repairs 

Call 665-2721 

Nights Call 

665-3263 or 665-2619 

Parker Electric 
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville 

following graduation, he 
earns $1,537 per month. 
New trooper assignments 
are based on regional needs. 
However, DPS academy 
graduates 	may 	request 
assignments 	in 	specific 
areas. 

Adams said all the can-
didates must be prepared for 
rigorous demands of the 
training. 

"It's a tough, intensive 
course which is designed to 
ensure quality and 
professionalism in the finest 
traditions of law enfor-
cement. Some of the trainees 
will find the course too 
demanding or decide that 
another career is best for 
them," Adams said. 

DPS trooper applicants 
must be between 20 and 35 
years old and have a 
minimum of 60 hours of 
college level credit. Each 
candidate will undergo a 
personal history review and 
must be in excellent health. 

Adams said the DPS has 
placed a high priority on the 
recruitment of minorities 
and females for uniformed 
service. 

Getting Winterish 
Just a few days before 

Winter's time for arrival on 
the calendar, it arrives on 
the thermometer. The 
reading got down to 31 
Tuesday after several days in 
the high thirties and early 
forties. 

At the same time moisture 
has a chance to stay within 
the previous record reading. 
The total after .15 last week 
is 50.14, still 1.66 under the 
old record of 51.80. 

Low and high tem-
perature readings of the 
week by Steve Moster were 
Dec. 10, 41 and 60; Dec. 11, 
50 and 56; Dec. 12, 40 and 
46; Dec. 13, 40 and 46; Dec. 
14, 39 and 47; Dec. 15, 31 
and 59; Dec. 16, 40 and 62. 

BETA KAPPA STRUDEL 

SALE 
Due  to  popie  

Sit plo 	91' Demand
. 

Y Dece,,, L  .fiber 19  
Fischer's Market 

Apple & Cheese 
$5.00 a bar 

Quantity Limited 

Ictetclvatoctetooctvo 
A great Christmas idea! 

1■..• 

4-H Club news 
• 

• 
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