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Shamrock Wins 
First In District 
Boxing Meet

The district boxing meet which 
was held here last Thursday, Fri­
day and Saturday nights, was ac­
claimed as the best to be held in 
this area this year. In most cases, 
the bouts were well matched and 
after the event was over there 
was very little doubt about the 
winners of each weight class be­
ing the best boxers to enter the 
meet.

Shamrock stacked up the most 
points throughout the three night 
period with a total of 14 to win 
first place and carry home the 
big, beautiful team trophy. Well­
ington was a close second with 13 
points and Clarendon ran a good 
third with 11 points. McLean 
scored three points and Canadian 
2 points.

The results of the bouts by the 
nights with some of the finals ap­
pearing on the card on Friday 
night are as follows:

THURSDAY NIGHT 
Grade School Division:

65 lb.—Vem Bettis, Canadian 
dec. by G. Phillips. Wellington; 
70 lb.—Bill Hill, Clarendon dec. 
R. Coleman, Wellington; 75 lb.— 
Jack Hupp, McLean dec. by D. 
Warrick, Wellington; 80 lb. — 
Bobby Davis, Clarendon dec. Cal 
Heitt, Wellington; 80 lb.—Ken­
neth Woods, Shamrock dec. Ben 
Darnell, McLean; 85 lb.— Carl 
Morgan, Clarendon dec. by J. 
Thompson, Wellington; 85 lb.— 
Wayne Moore, McLean tko’ed in 
1st round by Frankton Boyce, 
Shamrock; 90 lb.—Benny Edens, 
Clarendon tko’ed in 1st round by 
John Boyce, Shamrock; 112 lb.— 
Don Beard, Wellington ko’ed 
Doyle Bettis, Canadian in Xst 
round.
High School Division:

100 lb.—Wilbur Smith, Welling­
ton tko’ed Alvin Blackshure, Mc­
Lean in 1st round; 135 lb.—D. 
Littlefield, Clarendon dec. by Bill 
Plank, Wellington; 147 lb. Ken­
neth Stone, Shamrock dec. by 
Johnny Clark, Wellington; 155 lb. 
— T. Risenhoover, Clarendon 
ko’ed in 2nd round by Bill Combs, 
Wellington.

FRIDAY NIGHT 
Grade School:

65 lb.—Gordon Moore, Claren­
don dec. Joe Billingsley, McLean; 
70 lb.—Steve O’Gorman, Sham­
rock dec. Don Crockett, McLean; 
75 lb.— Bill Hicks, Clarendon 
tko’ed in 2nd -by Clarence Jones, 
Shamrock; 80 lb.—Bobby Davis, 
Clarendon dec. Chas. Timmins, 
Canadian; 85 lb.—Franklin Boyce 
Shamrock ko’ed Roy Conyers, 
Canadian in 1st; 90 lb.— Jackie 
Bently, McLean dec. by Bob Hut-

Aceording to T. H. Seay, Voca­
tional Agricultural teacher at 
Clarendon, the Clarendon Chap­
ter of the Future Farmers of 
America will be very much in 
the State Fair Stock Show this 
year.

Their heavy Hereford calf, 
shown above, is reported to be 
one of the best. It is expected to 
give plenty of competition in the 
open show.

The Anderson-Clayton Cotton 
Oil Company gave Clarendon 
their start when they presented 
them with a calf during the 
Houston Fat Stock Show. The 
original calf did not have show 
possibilities. Frank Foxall of 
Memphis, who checked the pro­
gress of the calf, thought another 
calf with greater show qualities 
should be bought. At this sugges 
tion the calf was sold and the 
hunt started for a good show calf

At the Amarillo Fat Stock 
Show Mr. Seay and the boys 
found the calf that they had been 
looking for. Shortly after the calf 
entered the sale ring the bidding 
had gone higher than they could 
afford, but not for Pat Slavin of 
Clarendon who was buying for 
the McMurtry Ranch. He bought 
the calf and presented it to the 
Clarendon Chapter for the price 
of the original calf. The McMur­
try Ranch willingly took a seven­
teen cents per pound loss on the 
transaction.

The calf weighed 660 at the 
time of purchase. The boys \iope 
to make him weigh 1200 by the 
time the State Fair rolls around 
next fall. '

If the calf measures up to ex­
pectation, the Chapter intends to 
buy a pick-up truck so that they 
will have transportation for sum 
mer trips, shows, and contests.

chinson, Canadian (final bout); 
105 lb. — Eugene Collingsworth, 
Shamrock ko’ed Dale Cook, Ca­
nadian in 2nd round.
High School:
100 lb.—Billy Bo*V Adams, Clar­
endon dec. Travis Burson, Sham­
rock; 118 lb. — Gilbert Stewart 
tko’ed Cliff Callahan. McLean in 
2nd; 135 lb. — John Christner, 
Shamrock ko’ed in 2nd by John 
Vineyard, McLean; 126 lb. — 
Jonny Sagner, Shamrock dec. by 
Billy Karnes, Wellington (final); 
147 lb.—Fred Molesworth, Clar­
endon, tko’ed Earl Trimball, Mc­
Lean in 2nd round.

SATURDAY NIGHT 
(Finals)

Grade School:
65 lb.—Gordon Moore, Claren­

don dec. Gary Phillips, Welling­
ton; 70 lb.—Bill Hill, Clarendon 
dec. S. O’Gorman, Shamrock; 
75 lb.—Clarence Jones. Shamrock 
dec. Orlie Warrick, Wellington; 
80 lb.—Kenneth Woods, Sham­
rock dec. Bobby Davis, Claren­
don; 85 lb. — Frankton Boyce, 
Shamrock tko’ed Jimmy Thomp­
son, Wellington in 1st round; 
90 lb.—Bob Hutchinson, Canadian

Home Freezer Demonstration To Be 
Held Thursday, April 29th

Miss Norma Lantz, Philco 
home economist, will jdiscuss and 
demonstrate points of frozen food 
chests to the general public at a 
free Philco Freezer demonstration 
at 7:30 p. m. at the Rundell & 
Estlack Machinery Company.

This is the first demonstration 
of this nature to be held here and 
Miss Lantz will demonstrate all 
the advantages of a home freezer 
and how to prepare the many 
foods that may be stored in one 
of these units.

She has pointed out that it is 
not necessary to own a freezer 
chest in order to benefit from the 
demonstration. The shortcuts to 
housekeeping which Miss Lantz 
will demonstrate will be applic­
able to any type freezer chest, 
locker plant drawer, and even the 
small storage space which is in­
cluded in many of the advance 
refrigerator models being sold to­
day.

Rundell & Estlack is sponsoring 
the demonstration which is en­
tirely free to the public and are 
urging everyone interested to at­
tend so that they may gain much 
helpful information that may be 
of greet benefit in the future. 
Remember the hour is 7:30 p. m. 
next Thursday night, April 29th.

OYER 4 HUNDRED ATTEND  
AIR BREAKFAST SUNDAY

The Air breakfast held here 
Sunday morning, sponsored by 
Joe Jones, Mrs. J. Fred Smith and 
the Aviation club, was a great 
success with approximately over 
four hundred people in attend­
ance with over two hundred of 
them flying in from surrounding 
towns over the Panhandle and 
New Mexico. The visiting planes 
to land at the local field were 
counted at 110 and that was 
quite a sight to see so many 
planes circling the field, awaiting 
an opportunity to land, and it 
took approximately an hour for 
the majority of the planes to get 
in the air again after the flyers 
had finished their breakfast.

And in speaking of the break­
fast, there were plenty of mouths 
to be fed and the chow line 
stretched out two hundred feet 
or more. There was plenty bacon 
and eggs and everyone seemed to 
enjoy the occasion very much. 
Approximately 200 town people 
arose early to go out to' the field 
and help welcome the visiting 
flyers and watch the arrival and 
departure of the planes.

Much Needed Rain 
Vets .85 Inch Here
The big heavy clouds which 

have been passing over for sev­
eral days finally decided to turn 
loose Wednesday afternoon and 
last night to quineh the thirst of 
the parched ground that has 
taken a beating from the strong 
winds of the past few weeks. The 
total precipitation recorded by 
the official weather station at the 
airport was .85 inch and a good 
portion of this amount fell rea­
sonably slow whereby it was of 
more benefit.

Farm and ranch land in this 
area were beginning to need the 
rain pretty bad. There has been 
enough moisture to hold the 
wheat in fairly good shape and 
get the grass started growing, but 
it would have been only a short 
time until it would have been an 
altogether different picture.

The rain seemed to be general 
all over the Panhandle area with 
the heavier rain being recorded 
to the northeast. It was consider­
ed more or less a life saver of the 
wheat on much of the plains area 
as the crops there were in very 
bad condition.

This is probably just the start­
ing as thunder showers are fore­
cast for the next several days and 
this is the time of year that we 
usually experience rains of flood 
proportions.

W I N ''OuttHi
CORNERS

BAND PARENTS TO SPONSOR 
THE AMARILLO HIGH SCHOOL 
A CAPELLA CHOIR, MAY 6

If we could remember to look 
up to no one, even though they 
might have robbed a bank; or, 
down on anyone, even though 
they might have written a col­
umn, but to look for the good in 
every one, we would be better off 
in life.

We can do without the necessi­
ties of life until we will apprec­
iate them. Anyway, when I was a 
boy I thought that corn bread 
and sweet milk; brown beans 
with pork boiled in them was 
just something to keep little boys 
and girls of poor families, like 
ours, from starving to death. Now, 
when Mama has time to cook 
them, I cat and I eat, and then 
want to save the left-overs for the 
next meal. I wonder how many of 
the everyday things would seem 
like luxuries if we suddenly 
didn’t have them.

SERVICES HELD MONDAY 
FOR T. J. GILLESPIE

Funeral, services were held 
Monday afternoon at the Wom­
ack Funeral Chapel for Thomas 
J. Gillespie with Rev. S. W. 
Hayne officiating.

Mr. Gillespie, age 61, passed 
away April 18 in an Amherst 
hospital. He had been a resident 
of Clarendon and Ashtola off and 
Oil since 1938. He moved to Don­
ley county from Stonewall Co.

He is survived by two sisters, 
Mrs. Ida M. Wallace of Clarendon 
and Mrs. Minnie Shadle of Cor­
pus Christi; two brothers, Geo. 
Gillespie of Peacock, Texas and 
Joe Gillespie of Decatur. Also 
several nephews and nieces.

Pallbearers were John White. 
Pete White, Ben Lovell, H. S. 
Mahaffey, J. R. Brandon and D. 
L. Vaughn.

Interment was in Citizens 
Cemetery with the Womack Fun­
eral Home in charge of arrange­
ments.

dec. John Boyce, Shamrock 
100 lb.—Gene Baird, Wellington 
dec. Van Pennington, Shamrock 
105 lb.— Eugene Collingsworth 
Shamrock tko’ed Freddy Dristcr 
McLean in Jstrj’’ 11# !b —Lestef 
Ramsy, Shamrock tko’ed Don 
Beard, Wellington in 1st.
High School:

100 lb.—Wilber Smith, Welling­
ton ko’ed Billy Bob Adams, Clar­
endon in 1st; 118 lb.— Gilbert 
Stewart, Clarendon tko’ed Joe 
Landrum, Shamrock in 1st; 
135 lb.—John Vineyard, McLean 
dec. Bill Plank, Wellington; 
147 lb.—Fred Molesworth, Clar­
endon dec. Johnny Clark, Well­
ington; Heavyweight—Dickie An­
drews, McLean ko'ed Bob Phil­
lips. Wellington in 1st.

In the exhibition fights, Ken­
neth Davis tko’ed Elmo Sams, 
Lakeview in 2nd; Roydon Brow­
er, Shamrock tko’ed Bill Combs, 
Wellington in 3rd.

DONLEY CO. CONSUMERS 
DECLARE DIVIDEND

The Donley County Consumers 
organization recently declared a 
three percent dividend, and al­
though a number of the stock­
holders have received their 
checks, the thing that is worry­
ing the manager, F. O. Naylor, is 
that) n number haven* received * is one of the State, directors

For a medicine to be good I 
wonder why it has to either: 
smell bad, taste bad, or, bum 
when you rub it on. Anyway, if 
you have to have some ailment, 
don’t have something that looks 
like it might last for seven years, 
and feels the same way. Even if 

| you try to pronounce what the 
Doctor said you had, people still 
give you that funny look.

Had a nice letter this week 
from Joe Hatton of Amarillo. Joe

MRS. J. F. JACKSON 
BURIED HERE TUES.

Funeral services were held 
Tuesday afternoon at the First 
Baptist church for Mrs. Lora 
Melvina Jackson with Rev. Ernest 
Phillips officiating.

Mrs. Jackson, age 51, passed 
away at a Memphis hospital Mon­
day following a quite lengthy ill­
ness. She had been a resident of 
the Goldston community and 
Donley County for the past 10 
years. Prior to moving to Donley 
County, she was a resident of Hall 
County for 17 years. She was a 
member of the First Baptist 
church.

Survivors include her husband, 
four daughters, No»-a Arline, 
Edith Lee, Geraldine and Patsy 
Jean all of Clarendon; three sons, 
William of Amarillo, Frank and 
Kenneth of Clarendon; her step­
mother, Mrs. J. H. Ashcraft of 
Clarendon; six sisters, Miss Em­
ma Ashcraft, Clarendon; Mrs. F. 
D. Adkins and Mrs. Joe Marcum 
of Amarillo, Mrs. Emmett Ware, 
Wellington, Mrs. M. L. Adkins, 
Loco, and Mrs. Tom Scoggins of 
Lakeview; three brothers. J. C., 
W. W. and J. L. Ashcraft of Clar­
endon and one grandson.

Pallbearers were Sam Dale, W. 
H. Gray, Roy Roberson, Houston 
McDonald, Bill Littlefield and 
Odell McBrayer.

Burial was in Citizens Ceme­
tery with the Murphy-Spicer- 
Buntin Funeral Home in charge 
of arrangements.

Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Morrison 
and family of Pampa visited his 
mother, Mrs. J. W. Morrison Sun.

their checks and he has no record 
of their present address. He is 
asking all those interested to 
come by and pick up their money 
or inform him of their mailing 
address.

OPINION RULES COUNTY  
MUST M AINTAIN  OFFICE

AUSTIN, Texas—The office of 
the attorney general ruled Satur­
day, April 10th that the office of 
county superintendent of schools 
may not be abolished in Donley 
County.

R. Y. King, county attorney, 
wrote that since the school popu­
lation had dropped to 1,700 “the 
people are now anxious to abolish 
the office.

However, the attorney general 
ruled that under present law the 
office could be neither abolished 
nor discontinued.

MRS. OLIVER ELLIOTT WILL 
PRESENT PIANO PUPILS 
IN  RECITAL APRIL 28

Mrs. Oliver Elliott will present 
her piano pupils in recital at the 
College Auditorium Wednesday 
evening, April 28 at 8:30 o’clock.

Students appearing on the pro­
gram include: Jonna Lee Blocker, 
Elena Donald, Allen Homer Est­
lack, Jackie Estlack, Amy Ruth 
Hudson, Montit Hubbard, Louva 
Hunt, Richard Kennedy, Ruth 
King, Kay Lane, David Lowell, 
Jack Lowell, Mary Francis Mc- 
Cully, Melba Newberry, Vivian 
Newberry, John Payne, Harlene 
Smith, Layma Tatum, Cynthia 
Thomberry.

The public is cordially invited 
to attend.

SOIL CONSERVATION WORK 
IN  COMMUNITY "A" UNDER 
THE 1948 AAA PROGRAM

Donley County is divided into 
8 AAA Communities. Community 
“A" is that part of the county 
north of the Salt Fork of Red 
River and east to a line about 
even with Alanreed. Much of this 
community in the county is graz­
ing land. There are only 85 work­
sheets covering the farms and 
ranches in this community.

The AAA Community commit­
teemen for Community “A” are: 
Clarence J. Merrick, Roy H.

(See SOIL, back page)

the Farm Bureau, in addition 
being an all around good fellow 
Anyway, he warned me to hide 
all the Farm Bureau papers, and 
not let Mama read about the Nn 
tional Farm Bureau Convention 
next December in Atlantic City, 
N. J. I hid them from Mama but 
I get them out once in awhile and 
dream about the trip myself. 
Don’t know what about taking 
Mama along inasmuch, as the 
trip includes a few days at Ni­
agara Falls. Thanks again Joe.

Offered our column to a few 
more of the better Weeklies in 
the Panhandle area, and the 
nicest “No” that we received was 
from W. R. Rutherford of the 
Moore Co. News. Anyone can say 
Yes and make (he other fellow 
feel good, but, few people can say 
no and still leave you feeling 
good. Anyway, Mr. Bill can, and 
I will get that new ribbon for my 
typewriter and make those other 
adjustments that he suggested, 
and then write him a letter, as he 
suggested. Thanks Mr. Bill.

The biggest event due to hap­
pen in Claude this year seems to 
be the Rodeo on July 30 and 31. 
Although everyone is asked to 
help promote and put on this 
years show, the Legion is really 
going all out, bending over back­
wards, robbing their piggy banks, 
and doing everything possible to 
make this years show equal to 
that of any size town. Anyway, 
they asked me to especially invite 
my friends in Canadian, Claren­
don, Vega, and other folks to 
come over and visit with us. Free 
Barbecue, parades and all the 
other trimmings will go along 
with it. I appreciated them think-

POSTMASTER ATTENDS 
TEXAS MINERAL 
CONVENTION

Among the several hundred to 
show exhibits of gem stone pro­
ducts at the annual meeting of the 
State Mineral Society in Austin 
Saturday and Sunday was Post­
master J. C. Estlack.

At the close of the meeting in 
a state-wide contest, Estlack won 
second prize for best general ex­
hibit. The prize is a pendant 
brooch set In gold, a product ef 
the Bujard firm in Alpine, Texas.

Thirteen states were represent­
ed with exhibits. Only Texas 
members of the Texas State 
Mineral Society were eligible to 
compete for prizes of which there 
were ten, and five ribbons were 
given for crystal exhibits.

During the business session, the 
Postmaster was elected a member 
of the Board of Directors of the 
Texas State Mineral Society.

One of the outstanding enter­
taining programs of the spring 
season will be enjoyed by Donley 
County people when the Amarillo 
High School A Capella Choir, di­
rected by Julia Dean Evans, 
comes to the new high school 
gymnasium here on May 6th, un­
der the sponsorship of the local 
Band Parents.

The Choir is composed of ap­
proximately one hundred voices 
and does honor to the prestige it 
has built up over the Panhandle 
during the past few years. The 
Choir will feature a varied pro­
gram of religious, popular and 
novelty numbers.

The proceeds from the even­
ing’s entertainment will go to 
bolster the treasury of the Band 
Parents—a needy cause which 
further assures success of the 
high school band through pur­
chasing of needed equipment and 
the repairing qf instruments 
needing reconditioning.

The price of admission for this 
type of skilled entertainment is 
well within the reach of every­
one. Adult tickets will sell for 
$1.00 and students and children 
for 50c. The program will begin 
promptly at 8 o’clock, Thursday, 
May 6th. Keep in mind this date 
and make It a “must” on your 
calendar of entertainment. You 
will thrill to talented voices 
blended in harmony as thiSt.choir 
and their able director briiyg out 
the beauty in ’every number 
rendered.

•t(

ing that a lot of folks read our 
column, and am glad to be of ser­
vice. Thanks Legionnaires, and 
pass me a second helping of that 
good barbecue and stack those 
beans up a little higher.

Listening this morning to 
George Young interview Honest 
Bill Miller of Spearman, I won­
dered if he got that name by be­
ing honest. Guess so.

Cecil says, my trouble wras 
meanness working out. I should 
be a good boy now.

Just received a nice letter from 
Mr. Holly Wood of Lelia Lake. 
Mr. Wood accuses me of doing a 
lot of grunting in my last column 
about my sore neck. Anyway, I 
am better now and to make me 
feel even better he invited me to 
have supper with the Farm Bu­
reau folks around there on Mon­
day evening, April 26th at the 
Lelia Lake school house. Thanks 
for the invitation and for the op­
portunity to get acquainted with 
the folks. If possible I will sure 
be there. One of my weaknesses, 
and I have a lot of them, is coco­
nut pie. However, I wouldn’t 
want to drop a hint.

This large and accomodating swimming pool is ona of tha many 
recreation facilities offered those attending Pan-Fork Encampment 
this summer—July 19-23 for girls and July 29-30 for boys.

Pan-Fork<is a Summer Assembly sight that has been made avail­
able to the Baptist Churches of the Panhandle Plains area of the 
state. It is located near Wellington on the 8alt-fork of the Red river. 
The site is covered with many beautiful trees and has a stream of 
running water crossing it. Some $20,000.00 of permanent improve­
ments are being constructed for use this summer.

American Legion 
To Sponsor Jwtfor 
Baseball League

T h e  local American Legion post 
voted Tuesday night to sponsor a 
Junior Baseball League in Donley 
County this coming summer and 
practice sessions are scheduled to 
start just as soon as school is 
turned out.

Clifford Johnson, Hedley Leg­
ionnaire and District chairman of 
the youth baseball program, met 
with the group and stated that 
the Hedley youth had been play­
ing under this program for the 
past three years and it was 
working out fine.

George Thompson will ajssume 
the duties of coaching the team, 
and a team manager is to be an­
nounced within the near future.

Those eligible to play on the 
team will be boys who had not 
reached their 17th birthday on 
January 1, 1948 and any boy un­
der this age Is eligible to play. 
The deadline for enrollment will 
be May 30th and the boys birth- 
certificate must accompany his 
application which will be present­
ed to the club manager when his 
identity is announced.

The team will have an oppor­
tunity to play a number of teams 
from neighboring towns over the 
Panhandle who are qualified un­
der this program. It will give the 
youth a good clean sport and will 
include lots of the smaller boys 
who are not physically able to 
play football, etc., a Legion 
spokesman stated.

The Legion has already had 
some offers from business firms 
to furnish the suits and it is ex­
pected that a number of other 
firms will be happy to help take 
care of the other equipment

We will publish more particu­
lars in regard to the entire set-up 
just as soon as the program is 
complete.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hill of Dum­
as, Texas are the proud parents of 
a son born April 16 in Northwest 
Texas hospital in Amarillo. His 
name is John Paul His grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. H. B. 
Hill of Clarendon.

Mrs. Robert Bannister and baby 
and Mrs. Alfred Shields of Ama­
rillo visited their sister and fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Crutchfield.
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Mrs. B. L. Collier of Hedley is 
spending the week in the H. W. 
Lovell home and is visiting a 
number of other friends while 
here.

Our community is again sad­
dened by the sudden death of Mr. 
Tom Gillespie Sunday at the 
Amherst Hospital, and we wish to 
express our sincere sympathy to 
Mrs. Ida Wallace, his sister and 
Mr. and Mrs. Leo Wallace, as well 
as the rest of the family from dis­
tant points.

We wish to express deepest 
sympathy to Mr. and Mrs. Edwin 
Mills in the loss of their baby, 
also Mr. and Mrs. Edd Mills and

Dr. Keith S. Lowell
GENERAL PRACTICE 

AND SURGERY

Offices in Goldston Bldg. 
Residence Phone 174 

Office Phone 12$

family of this community.
Mr. and Mrs. C. B. Harp were 

surprised last week when her 
brothers arrived for a visit. They 
were W. I. Anderson of Leveland 
and J. B. Anderson of Ft. Worth. 
Her sister, Mrs. A. G. Holmes who 
has been with her for some time 
left the last of the week for Braw- 
ley, Calif. Miss Laura Mae Harp 
and Mrs. Merle Thompson spent 
the weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Harp and Lucky.

Mr. and Mrs. E. J. Johnson and 
Muru had a grand time Sunday 
entertaining their little grand­
daughter while its parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Melton Bagwell visited 
in Shamrock.

Mr. and Mi's. Everett Miller and 
Billy Lee Ramsay of Phillips 
visited Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Poov- 
ey Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. L. O. Morris and 
Ray and Doris Jean Wallace, 
Kenneth Davis and Mary Edna 
Elmore and Royce Morris and 
Mary Cox spent Sunday at Lake 
McClellan. They were celebrat­
ing Royce’s birthday. They all re­
ported a very enjoyable time.

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Brandon 
spent Sunday afternoon in Child­
ress visiting Mr. and Mrs. Doug 
Doshier.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyce Graham 
and boys spent awhile Friday nite 
in Memphis.
u aalay  County Lo»4tr 92.SO yr. In C onnt*

Mid-West Farmers 
Marketing Own 
Tractor Tires

The Tanners of the mid-west 
have developed and are market­
ing their own tractor tires, ac­
cording to F. O. Naylor, manager 
of the Donley County Consumers, 
a cooperative association operat­
ing in this community. This trac­
tor tire, which is superior in de­
sign and function, is distributed 
exclusively through farm cooper­
ative organizations under the 
Co-op trade name- and contains 
many new features that are the 
result of years of study and re­
search by farm organizations. 
This new tire, which has been de­
veloped by farmers by writing 
their own specifications, offers 
greater traction, greater wearing 
surfaces, has greater cleaning 
action, 12% wider bars and 45% 
wider shoulder bars, stronger re­
inforcement and a stronger car­
cass. It is designed to do a better 
job for the farmer who controls 
the molds in which it is made and 
the distribution system which 
brings it to him on a cooperative 
basis.

This new tractor tire is expect­
ed to have a revolutionary effect

on the use of farm traction equip­
ment, Mr. F. O. Naylor stated. 
The Co-ops have done a great job 
in developing this tire and it will 
be of great benefit to the farmer, 
he said, and the price is in line or 
a little lower than ordinary trac­
tor tires, to say nothing of the re­
fund the farmer will receive back 
from his cooperative.

The local cooperative, Donley 
County Consumers, is one of the 
5,810 cooperative organizations in 
the mid-west, serving and owned 
by 3,000,000 farmers, that have 
banded together to secure farm 
supplies on a cooperative basis.

*  M A R T I N  ♦
♦ By Mrs. J. H. Helton ♦ 
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

Mr. and Mrs. Guy Sibley and 
daughters Joanne and Wanda, 
Rev. and Mrs. Hendricks from 
Plainview visited in the F. C. 
Crofford home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Freeman Helton 
of Okla. City visited Friday and 
Saturday in the home of his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Helton.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Hutchins 
shopped in Amarillo Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Wald­
rop and Tommy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Hudson and Miss Mavis 
Hudson visited Sunday with Mr.

IN MISERY HALF THE 
TIME; BLESSES RETONGA

Important Announcement
GENUINE K-S ROTARY SCRAPER

P R IC E S
GREATLY

R E D U C E D

Suffered for Years From 
Gas On Stomach, Indiges­
tion, Restlessness.
Muscular Aches And Pains-* 
Mother Of Eight Wants 
Others To Know About 
Retonga
“No one know’s better than my 

husband how much Retonga has 
helped me,” declares Mrs. Ed D. 
Nunnelley, well-known resident 
of RFD No. 2, Ohatchee, Alabama, 
whose husband has farmed on his 
present homesite for 57 years. The 
mother of eight children, Mrs. 
Nunnelley gratefully states:

“I was in misery half the time 
from sour stomach and indiges­
tion. I often felt like gas was 
pressing against my chest so hard 
1 had to gasp for breath. I 
couldn't seem to sleep sound. 1 
had to take strong purgatives like 
salts to get relief from sluggish 
elimination. I was on edge most of 
the time. Muscular aches and

pains ran through me like darts. 
I felt so run-down I was cross 
with myself for complaining so 
much. I always got up feeling 
worse than w'hen I went to bed.

“Retonga was truly a blessing 
and a relief to me. I eat anything 
now and my food seems to give 
me the strength and energy I 
need. I sleep fine and no longer 
depend on harsh laxatives for re­
lief from sluggish bowels. I feel 
easy after meals and am not 
bothered with excessive gas. The 
muscular aches and pains are re­
lieved, and I have regained much 
of my lost weight.”

Retonga is intended to relieve 
distress due to insufficient flow 
of digestive juices in the stomach, 
loss of appetite, borderline Vita­
min B-l deficiency, and constipa­
tion. The active ingredient# of 
Retonga are purely herbal, com­
bined with Vitamin B-l. You can 
get Retonga at Rexall Drug 
Store.—Adv.

S A V E
A T  THIS AMAZINGLY

LOW PRICE

SAME HIGH QUALITY 
PLUS Improved Design 

Greater Strength
NOW - - you can own tho world's UghtMt-drmft. best perform 
tag, longest-lasting Rotary Scraper at tremendous savings • - 
Below pro-war prices.

Get your K-S Scraper at oncal Loads and unloads soil, 
manure, sand, ate.. Fastar. Eaalarl • • without stoppingl Tha 
operator, with a clear viaw from tha tractor asat, fills tha 
scraper, dumps the load In on# placa or spraads It to any thick- 
naas. Or, bulldossa tha load backward. Greatly reduces the 
cost of filling gullies, building ditchss and dams, lavallng land, 
terracing, soil conssrvation work, ate.

Lighter Draft—a Jaap will operate the 4-ft. size: any 1 
or 2-plow tractor w ill oparata the 4-ft. and 5-ft. sizes*

All steel, electrically welded, built extra rugged for hard­
est use. Self-sharpening replaceable blade. Guaranteed.

Available For Immediate Delivery

Reserve D istric t No. 11 S ta te  No. 819

R EPO R T O F CONDITION OF

THE FARMERS STATE BANK
of C larendon, Texas, a t  th e  rloae of business A pril 12, 1948

A 8 ta te  bank ing  institu tion  organ ised  and opera tin g  under th e  bank ing  laws of 
th is S ta te  and a  mem ber of the  Federal Reserve System . Published in accord- 
ance w ith a call made by the  S ta te  B anking A u tho rities  and  by th e  Federal 
Reserve Bank of th is  D istric t.

ASSETS
Cash, balances w ith o ther banks, including reserve balance, and cash
item s in process of c o lle c tio n __ _r _________________________ ________ $645,886.89
U nited  8 ta te s  Governm ent obligations, d irect and  g u a ra n te e d  _   296,767.00
O bligations of S tgtes and political s u b d iv is io n s  . . . . . . . . . _________  49,046.84
C orporate  stoeka (including  81.960.00 stock of Federal Reserve b a n k ) . .  1,960.00
Loans and discounts (Including 82.066.88 o v e rd ra fts) . . . ___________ _ 662.886.68
Bank prem ises owned $7,122.00, fu rn itu re  and flx tu rsa  $6,844.97 ____ 18.466.67
Real e s ta te  owned o ther th an  bank p re m is e s ___________ ____________  1.00
O ther assets . . . __ . . . — ________ . . . . . . _________ . . . _____ . . . ____ ____ 600.00

TOTAL A S S E T S ............ ........................................................................ $1,661,922.2$

$80.00
For 4 ft. also

FOR LIMITED TIME ONLY

RUNDELL & ESTLACK
Clarendon. Toxas

LIABILITIES
Demand deposits of individuals, partnersh ip s, and c o rp o ra tio n * ___ $1,441,864.60
Tim e deposits of individuals, pa rtn e rsh ip s, and c o rp o ra tio n s _________  66.560.88
Deposits of U nited S tates G overnm ent (Including posts 1 s a v in g s ) ____ 40,891.08
Deposits of 8 ta tss  and political subdivisions _________ ___________ . . . .  17,672.72
O ther deposits (certified  and o fficers’ checks, e t c . ) __________   8,869.14

TOTAL D E P O S IT S ............................................................91,678,927.82
O ther liabilities ______________________________________________________ 62.60

TOTAL L IA B IL IT IE S (n a t including subordinated obliga­
tio n . shown below) ______________________________________ $1,878,999.42

_____________  9

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS
C apital* ____________ _________ _______________________________________ $ 60.000.00
Surplus ---------------------------------------------------   14.600.00
Undivided p r o f i t s ___ . . . __________ . . . . . . ______ ____. . . _______ ______  17,141.81
Roservm (and re tirem en t account fo r p referred  cap ita l) . . . . . . . . . . . .  2.000.06

TOTAL C A PIT A L  A C C O U N T S ............................................................  82,841.81

TOTAL L IA B IL IT IE S  AND C A PIT A L A C C O U N T S _______$1,991,982.28

*Thls b ank ’s cap ital consists o f:
Common stock w ith to ta l p a r  value of . . . . . . ______$£0,000.00

MEMORANDUM
A ssets pledged o r assigned to  secure liabilities and fo r o ther purposes $110,000.00

I. V an Kennedy, Cashier, of the  above-nam ed bank, hereby certify  th a t 
th e  above sta tem en t is tru e  to  the  boat of my know ledge and  belief.

VAN KEN N ED Y . Cashier
C O R R E C T -A T T E S T :

G. F. LEA TH ERS
FRANK W H ITE J r .  D irectors.

J .  D. SW IFT

S ta te  e f Texas, County o f Donley, se t v

Sworn to  and  subscribed before m s th is  20th day o f A pril, 1948.

(SEAL) EMMETT O. SIMMONS. Notary Public.

andand Mrs. D. C. Stevenson 
Juanelle.

Jackie, Lary and Mike Phillips 
of Pampa are staying with their 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. J. H. 
Helton while their mother is in 
the hospital after a serious oper­
ation.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Hare vis­
ited in the Ross Brown home Sun.

Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Helton, Mr. 
and Mrs. Freeman Helton and 
Larry, Jackie, Mike Phillips 
visited Mrs. Lavell Phillips at the 
Worley hospital at Pampa Friday.

Mrs. Stevenson, Jaunelle and 
Mrs. Hutchins visited awhile 
Monday evening with Mrs. Hel­
ton.

♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦
J H U D G I N S  ♦
♦  Mrs. S. M. Sw p ♦
♦  r.

There were not so many out for 
Sunday school but hope all will 
be back.

Mr. and Mrs. Dane Perdue, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ben Talley, Imogene1 
Elliott, Jack Brogdon, Geraldine 
Perdue and Glen Hall all went to 
the Cap Rock picnicking Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. S. M. Harp spent 
one day last week with Mr. and

Mrs. L. M. Putman of Goldston.
Gerald and Dewie Foster of 

Clarendon spent Saturday night 
with Haskel Foster.

Mr. L. L. Foster spent Saturday 
night and Sunday in the W. O. 
Elliott home.

Word was learned that Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Mooring are the proud 
parents of a baby boy. Mrs. Moor­
ing is known as Miss Nova Lee 
Barker.

Mr. and Mrs. John Perdue 
spent Sunday in the Harp home.

Mr. I. J. Self spent part of last 
week in Oklahoma.

Don Barker and Sidney Harp 
spent part of last week in Clar­
endon.

John Perdue and S. M. Harp 
called in the O. L. Jacobs home of 
Clarendon Sunday afternoon.

Dr. and Mrs. Robert Lee from 
Corpus Christi, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bomer Skelton of Panhandle, Mr. 
and Mrs. Willard Skelton and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Durwood 
Skelton and Durwood Jr. and 
Bobbie Skelton were dinner 
guests of their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Luther Skelton Thursday 
evening.

s. c. BELL
Rspracsnling

RESERVE LIFE INSURANCE 
COMPANY

Hospital - Sick It Accidoni 
Policies

Res. Phone 164-R

C H U K - L - E T S
By W illia m  W h its e ll

Ssy, ysu msU 5ms • bsastifd baby!"

WHI T S EL L  DRUG
Ssa4wi<H#1 Sodo f OUAtO'B

Clorendon, Tc*o%

We know that a sympathetic understanding is 
more important during your bereavement than at 
any other time. That is why you are assured that 
everything will be handled in a dignified manner 
when you come to us.

Calm, sympathetic and tactful service are/
yours at a moment's notice.

AMBULANCE s e r v ic e  d a y  o r  n i g h t

MURPHY-SPICERBUNTIN 
FUNERAL HOME

PHONE 160 DAY OR NIGHT

M A N N ’S
Malted Milk B r e a d

Is Preferred by More and More Housewives!
‘ We like MANN’S MALTED MILK BREAD because of its fine texture—it’s 
smooth, even, easy to spread.” That’s just a sample of comment from house­
wives which grocers pass on to us-

MANN’S BREAD is fresh, too, and full of nutrition and goodness. It makes 
perfect breakfast toast, and adds extra appeal to lunchboxes. Try a loaf 
today, and treat your family to good news in bread!

AND, REMEMBER - - -

IT’S DELIVERED DAILY TO YOUR 
FAVORITE FOOD STORE

CALL TO* - - -

M A N N ’S  B R E A D
• - • BY NAME

At Your Favorite Grocery Store



♦ ♦♦
♦ SKYLINE ♦

♦
♦ TIDINGS ♦

4
♦ By DODO ♦
♦ (the flightless bird) ♦

Dodo went to sleep last week 
and didn’t get the weekly gossip 
in, so I will just review over what 
happened last week.

Mr, Weldon Busnach took his 
solo XC (cross country) last Sat., 
but the wind got a little out of 
hand and he had to complete it 
Sunday.

Last Sunday was a very busy 
day out at the airport. There was 
all kinds of activity at the field 
that afternoon. Mr. Jack Mont­
gomery, mayor of Shamrock was 
over to get his little Erocoupe. Mr. 
Arron Fry of Shamrock flew over 
with Matthew Taylor for a few

Planting Seed
MACHA STORM PROOF COTTON SEED 

(Gin run seed)

MACHA STORM PROOF COTTON SEED 
(Culled, delinted and treated)

RED TOP CANE

ARIZONA COMBINE KAFFIR

YELLOW CORN

SWEET SUDAN

60 DAY MAIZE

All the above seed are second year seed and are
from certified pedigree seed.

Bennett Implement Company
Phone 52

CLARENDON, TEXAS

minutes visit with the boys at the 
field.

Everyone at the field has been 
very busy getting things ready for 
the big breakfast. I was out at the 
field Sat. and Mr. Joe Jones, Mrs. 
Edna Smith and Matthew Taylor 
were really hitting the high spots 
building tables, cleaning up a- 
round the field, making arrange­
ments for orchestras, radio pro­
grams, etc. They were so busy 
that I could hardly get any news.

If everyone put out half as 
much effort as these three do to 
get Clarendon in the news and to 
try and show that it is a wide a- 
wake town as they do, there 
would be no questions asked like, 
“Why doesn't Clarendon ever do 
anything?” Come on folks let’s 
wake up and help cooperate. Ad­
vertising never hurt anyone and 
it does a world of good even 
though it may cost a dollar or 
two.

Extra! We received word that 
the road crew was finally going to 
get to work on the airport road 
and make a road out of it instead 
of a cow trail. We at the airport 
are certainly glad to hear this and 
appreciate it whole heartedly.

There has been a little sign re­
moved and we would certainly 
appreciate it if they would take it 
easy on the airport signs. They 
cost money, kids!

Sunday was a very big day out 
at the old field; over a hundred 
airplanes of all makes, types, sizes 
and shapes were here. Gee. I have 
never seen so many planes and 
people in all my life. There were 
lots of local citizens out and we 
were sure glad to see so many out 
and to show so much interest. 
There was a 45 minute broadacst 
over station KMAQ interviewing 
pilots and spectators at the field

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER
as they came in. Have never seen 
so much bacon and eggs as the 
bunch behind the counter were 
dishing out. How about it, Mary?

We at the airport really apprec­
iate the help that you people gave 
us and especially the boys who 
furnished the music. Thanks go to 
F. G. Crofford, Jack Sutton, Bar­
ker Brummett, and Kermit Sloan.

There were people who attend­
ed the breakfast from as far as 
Avon, New York to the east; Post 
Texas to the south; Perry ton to 
the north, and Clovis, N. M. to the 
west. To the business establish­
ments that helped sponsor the 
radio program, we sincerely 
thank you and wish that there 
had been more firms to help out. 
Well, folks, I guess I have spouted 
off enough. Dodo.

Statement of Condition of

THE FARMERS STATE BANK
of Clarendon. Texas at the close of business April 12. 1948

Thursday, April 22, 1948

ASSETS

Loans & Discounts ...........................  $539,787.32
Overdrafts ..............................   2,056.83
Banking House. Furniture & Fixtures 13,466.67
Other Real Estate .....................   LOO
Stock in Federal Reserve Bank'........  1,950.00
Other Resources .............................. •. 500.00
Commodity Credit Corp. Loans 

Cotton & Wheat .. .$ .60,492.68 
U. S. Gov’t.

Securities ................  298,767.00
Municipal Bonds

& Warrants ...........  49,045.34
Cash Sc Due .

from Banks ...........  645,865.59 1,054.170.61

Total ..............  $1,661,932.23

LIABILITIES

Capital S tock .................................... $ 50,000.00

Surplus ...............................................  14,500.00

Undivided Profits .............................  17,341.81

Reserves .............................................. 2,000.00

Other Liabilities .........   62.60

DEPOSITS ......................................... 1.578,027.82

Total ..............  $1,661,932.23

OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS

J. D. Swift, President
J. H. Hum, Vice-Pres.

Van Kennedy. Cashier 
G. F. Leathers

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation 
Member of Federal Reserve System

Condensed Statement of the Condition of
THE DONLEY COUNTY STATE BANK

of Clarendon, Texas

Officers and Directors
Wesley Knorpp, President 

F. E. Chamberlain, Executive Vice-President 
J. L  McMurtry, Vice-President W. Carroll Knorpp, Cashier

M. R. Allensworth, Assistant Vice-President Walter B. Knorpp, Assistant Cashier 
W. J. Lewis C. T. McMurtry D. N. Grady

Close of Business April 12, 1948

RESOURCES
Loans and Discounts . . . .  T............$639,236.59
Overdrafts.....................................  2,580.28
School Warrants ........................... 8,778.97
Banking House, Furniture

and F ix tures..............................  4,001.00
U. S. Bonds

O w ned............ $1,070,000.00
Cash Sc Due

from Banks . . .  273,677.33 1,343,677.33

. T o ta l......................$1,998,274.17

LIABILITIES
Capital S to ck ................................ $ 50.000.00
Surplus ..........................................  23,000.00
Undivided P ro fits .........................  24,114.32
Reserves ........................................  1,204.17,
DEPOSITS.....................................1,899,955.68

Total ...................... $1,998,274.17

The above statement is correct: W. Carroll Knorpp, Cashier
Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

G O L D S T Q N
By WUma Smith

We wish to extend our sympa­
thy to the loved ones of Mrs. J. F. 
Jackson. She passed away early 
Monday morning. •

Mr. and Mrs. Mann Littlefield 
and son of Happy spent the week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Lit­
tlefield.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Eichelberge'r 
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Fontayne Elmore and family.

Mrs. Mode Hatley spent Thurs­
day night and Friday with Mr. 
and Mrs. R. V. Hatley in Ama­
rillo.

Kenneth Davis spent Wednes­
day night with Billy Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Higdon and 
family spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Littlefield.

Mr. Mode Hatley spent the 
weekend with his mother in 
Brownwood. Mr. and Mrs. Scaff 
stayed with Mrs. Hatley.

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Riley spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Roy

Brock.
Mr. and Mrs. Bud Philley spent 

Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. K. 
Davis.

Mrs. Owens and Mr. and Mrs. 
Price Webb spent Wednesday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Eddy Rey­
nolds.

Mrs. Collier Brock and family 
spent Sunday in Pampa.

Doyl Littlefield spent Sunday 
night with Billy Smith.

Jerry McBrayer fell while play­
ing at school and broke his arm.

Mr. and Mrs. H. M. Stewart, 
Mrs. Neely Hudson and Mrs. A1 
Devers and daughter visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Dick Eichelberger one 
evening last week.

Dr. J. Gordon Stewart
PHYSICIAN A SURGEON

Office in Latson Bldg. 
Ground Floor

Office Phone 239 
Residence Phone 253

DISSOLUTION OF 
PARTNERSHIP

State of Texas 
County of Donley

Whereas, by agreement made 
on or about November 1, 1946. 
Harry B. Lamkin and Herman B. 
Parson did enter into a co­
partnership known as the H-B 
Electric which business was elec­
trical appliances and contracting 
and whereas stock of goods and 
merchandise and business belong­
ing to the partnership at a value 
set and agreed upon by said 
parties.

That the said Herman B. Par­
son has the power to collect the 
debts now due to the partnership 
and receive any or all part of the 
same in the name of the same by 
suit at law or otherwise and that 
the said Herman B. Parson will 
assume .all indebtedness of said 
partnership and relieve the other 
partner of any further or future 
indebtedness or liability thereon 
and the said business is to be con­
ducted at the same place and in 
the same name in Clarendon, 
Texas, by the said Herman B. 
Parson.

Witness our hand this 5th. day 
of April, 1948.

Signed
Harry B. Lamkin 

H. B. Parson
(3-4c)

Joe Goldston
OPTOMETRIST
Goldston Bldg.

CLARENDON, TEXAS
Phono 36

Dr. George Shadid
DENTIST

Office Hours—8 a. m. to 6 p. m. 
Located In Goldston Bldg. 

Room 208
Office Phone 328 Res. 278-R

Athletes Foot Itch 
Not Hard To Kill.

In One Hour,
If not pleased, your 35c back at 
any drug store. TE-OL, a 
STRONG fungicide, contains 90% 
a l c o h o l .  IT PENETRATES. 
Reaches MORE germs to KILL 
the itch. Today at

Stocking's Drug Store

F o r  G o o d  I n s u r a n c e

K E L L Y
C H A M B E R L A I N

All T y p e s —-All  K i n d s

I ’R O M in  M J J l ’S I  M F.N TS

C l.tr.  n c l o n ,  I e x i t s

Condensed Statement

THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK
CLARENDON. TEXAS 

At Close of Business April 12. 1943

RESOURCES
Loans and Discounts.............................................................. $101,112.34
Stock in Federal Reserve Bank .......................................... 2,600.00
Banking House-Furniture-Fixtures ....................................  4,250.00
School Warrants 669.70
Other Resources............................................    295.90
UNITED STATES BONDS ......... $717,898.00
CASH AND SIGHT EXCHANGE ............. 275,654.30 993,552.30

T o ta l......... .................$1,102,480.24

LIABILITIES
Capital Stock ........................................................................$ 50.000.00
S urplus...................................................................................  36,200.00
Undivided P rofits..................................................................  17,519.04
Reserve ..................................................................................  3,000.00
DEPOSITS .............................................................................  995,761.20

9 —

T o ta l..........................$1,102,480.24

The First National Bank offers to its depositors every facility 
which their balances, business and responsibility warrant.

Member Federal Depoeit Insurance Corporation

W. H. Patrick, President Odoe Caraway, Vice-President 
W. W. Taylor, Cashier R. S. White, Asst. Cashier

Katherine Bugbee, Asst. Cashier

LIVES IN GLASS HOUSES...
Glass is so closely linked with everyday living that you can't imagine 

doing without i t  No, and there is no more vivid example of Nature's 
resources put to work for mankind than in glass. Sand, lime and soda by 

themaelves have little value, and their uses are relatively few. But 
when they are united in the form of usable glass products they take 

on new importance.
So it is with natural gas, too. This great natural resource would be worthless 

if left in the ground. It is only when companies like United Gas 
move it to market— make it available lor use—that it is given value. 

This is practical conservation... putting Nature’s resources to work. 
Efficient, low-cost natural gas sparks industrial development, 

creates new jobs, benefits all the families in Texas.

GLASS INDUSTRY
T « u i natural resource*. .. Texas 
labor ... and Tazaa capital. Thaaa 
arc tha factor* in tha success of the 
glass industry in our stata. This is 
Free Enterprise at work—providing 
good jobs for Texas people, spend­
ing large sums of money with local 
suppliers of materials and equip­
ment, and paying important tax 
money to the support of the state 
and local governments. The glass in­
dustry deserves your support for its 
efforts to build a more prosperous 
Texes* economy.

S B p N I T E D  G A S _____ Serving the ^

— *
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Th unday, April 12. 1MI

Fort Worth & Denver City Railway 
Announces Historical Essay Contest
In Observance of 75th Anniversary

♦-------------------------------------------
FORT WORTH (Spl.)—An es­

say contest, with a 10-day all-ex­
pense, escorted, Colorado vaca­
tion trip as the prize to each of 
five winners, has been announced 
by Fort Worth and Denver City 
Railway and its subsidiary. The 
Wichita Valley Railway, as a part 
of the observance of the 75th an­
niversary of the chartering of 
Fort Worth and Denver City Rail­
way Company by the Texas 
Legislature on May 26, 1873.

Hoinvr Bentley's m issus was 
working on her new sewing ma­
chine, when Homer comes in, draws 
up a chair, and starts talking: 
“ Don’t you think you’re running 
too fast 7" he saya. “ Slow down! 
Watch out! Be careful!**

When the missus finally turns 
with murder in her eyes, Homer 
says goodnaturedly: " I  thought 
you might like a little help, dear— 
like you help me drive the car.”

mitted in this contest is to be, 
“The History of Fort Worth and 
Denver City Railway (or The 
Wichita Valley Railway) in My 
Home County.”

It is pointed out by the rail­
road's headquarters in Fort Worth 
that a wealth of material on the 
early day history of Fort Worth, 
West Texas, and the Panhandle is 
tied closely to the history of the 
railroad itself, and that all his­
torical data is acceptable for the 
essays submitted, such as county

friendly glass of beer. The missus 
agrees to give up back-seat driving 
and nagging Homer about ashes on 
the rug. Homer agrees to quit cri­
ticizing Sarah's taste for flowery 
hats and parsley salad.

From where I sit, the key to get­
ting on together is meeting every 
issue half way — and overlooking 
any petty differences in tastes— 
whether these tastes apply to beer 
or flowery-looking hats!

records, stories or incidents re­
called and related by old settlers, 
old newspaper articles, matter 
from history books, biographies, 
etc., supported by early day 
photographs of the railroad's con­
struction or operation, if desired 
by contestants.

Detailed information relating 
to the contest rules and all of the 
features of this Diamond Jubilee 
celebration of 75 years of growth 
and development with West Tex­
as, the Panhandle, and Plains 
areas are to be shown in a series 
of advertisements to appear in 
newspapers throughout the West 
Texas area served by Fort Worth 
and Denver City and Wichita 
Valley Railways during the next 
six weeks.

Five contest districts have been 
designated, and the counties 
through which these railroads 
operate have been allocated to 
each district.

The Fort Worth District em­
braces Tarrant and Dallas Coun­
ties, and the town of Rhome,
Texas.

The Wichita Falls District em­
braces Wise County, except the 
town of Rhome, and the counties 
of Montague, Clay, Wichita, Wil­
barger, Hardeman, Archer, and 
Baylor.

Amarillo District embraces the 
counties of Childress, Hall, Don­
ley, Armstrong, Carson, Potter, 
Oldham, Hartley, Dallam, Col­
lingsworth, Wheeler and Gray.

Lubbock District includes the 
counties of Briscoe, Floyd, Hale, 
Swisher, Castro, and Lubbock.

Abilene District embraces the 
counties of Knox, Haskell, Jones, 
Taylor, Stonewell, Kent, and 
Dickens.

The winning essay in each dis­
trict is to be adjudged by a com­
petent, impartial team of three
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local judges in each of the towns 
named; the names of these judges 
are to be announced later.

Each district winner will be 
brought to Fort Worth by the 
railroad to participate in a 30- 
minute radio show to be present­
ed over Station WBAP—820, from 
10:30 P. M. to 11:00 P. M„ on 
Wednesday evening, May 26th, 
the date of the 75th anniversary 
of the Fort Worth and Denver 
City’s charter.

A comprehensive Colorado va­
cation trip is offered as the prize 
for the best essay in each district. 
The party of five winners, with 
an expert railroad passenger es­
cort in attendance, will leave on 
the Texas Zephyr the afternoon 
of Sunday, June 6th. Monday and 
Monday night, June 7th, are to be 
spent in Denver, with a sight­
seeing trip embracing the Denver 
Mountain Parks during Monday' 
afternoon.

Departure from Denver will be 
on Tuesday morning via Rocky 
Mountain Motor Company sight­
seeing bus for Chalet-Ranch in 
Rocky Mountain National Park, 
where Tuesday afternoon and 
night, June 8th, will be spent. On 
Wednesday morning, June 9th, a 
ride is to be taken over the world 
famous Trail Ridge Road to 
Grand Lake, for an afternoon and 
lodging that night.

Departure from Grand Lake 
Thursday morning, June 10th, 
will be early enough to connect 
with the Exposition Flyer at 
Granby, on the western slope of 
Colorado’s mountains, for a day­
light observation train ride to 
Glenwood Springs, Colorado. A 
stop of two nights will be made 
there.

During the day of Friday, June 
11th, a sightseeing trip will be 
made from Glenwood Springs to

Aspen, where an old Colorado 
mining town has been restored to 
its original western style.

The party will leave Glenwood 
Springs by train after breakfast 
Saturday, June 12th, for daylight 
ride through another section of 
Colorado’s mountains, surmount­
ing the Continental Divide at 
Tennessee Pass, and through the 
Royal Gorge for a late afternoon 
arrival in Colorado Springs.

Saturday night, June 12th, Sun­
day, and Sunday night, June 13th, 
and Monday morning, June 14th, 
will be spent at this famous Col­
orado mountain resort. A sight­
seeing tri pis planned here which 
will embrace all of the points of 
interest in the Colorado Springs- 
Pikes Peak area.

Return home will be on the 
Texas Zephyr, leaving Colorado 
Springs the afternoon of Monday, 
June 14th, placing all of the win­
ners back in their home towns on 
Tuesday, the 15th.

The essay contest rules are 
simple.

1. Any resident of a county in 
which these railways operate is 
eligible to participate, except em­
ployees of Burlington System 
Lines, comprised in Texas of Fort 
Worth and Denver City Railway, 
and The Wichita Valley Railway, 
and members of their families.

2. The subject of the essays 
must be, “The History of Fort 
Worth and Denver City Railway 
Company in My Home County;” 
in counties through which The 
Wichita Valley Railway operates, 
the subject is to be. “The History 
of The Wichita Valley Railway in 
My Home County.” In Wichita 
County where both railroads op­
erate, a contestant may write 
about either or both.

3. All essays submitted must be 
delivered to a ticket agent of Fort 
Worth and Denver City Railway, 
or The Wichita Valley Railway, 
or sent in by mail, addressed as 
follows, according to the district 
in which the contestant lives: 
Fort Worth District—

Burlington Lines Ticket Office 
806-B Houston Street 
Fort Worth 2, Texas 

Wichita Falls District— 
Burlington Lines General Agent 
506 Seventh 
Wichita Falls, Texas 

Amarlilo District—
Burlington Lines General Agent 
239-40-41 Amarillo Building 
Amarillo, Texas 

Lubbock District—
Burlington Lines General Agent 
1805 Avenue G 
Lubbock, Texas 

Abilana District—
Burlington Lines General Agent 
719 Mims Building 
Abilene. Texas
4. All essays must reach a Fort 

Worth and Denver City Railway 
or a Wichita Valley Railway 
ticket agent, or the proper ad­
dress by, or be postmarked to 
show that they were in the mails

D A N C E
EVERY SATURDAY NIGHT

to the music ci

THE TEXAS SWINGSTERS
at

l a k e  M cCl e l l a n

in the new
PUR-PAK 

SINGLE SERVICE 
CONTAINER

If It * fiordens I t 's Got To Be Good 
So Why Not Try Our Ice Cream. Too'

The mi-isuH can’t help hut burst 
nut lauchin*—and they settle what 
nuttht have been a quarrel over a

Copyright, IVtti, United States Hr ewers Foundation

> .
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SURPLUS

B U I L D I N G S
INCLUDING ALL THE FIXTURES pad  OFF S ITE  
THEY NOW  CONTAIN WILL BE hcp  n ilIV  
SOLD TO THE GENERAL PUBLIC USt UHLI

Pampa Army Airfield
PAMPA, TEXAS

MAY 4, 5 & 6, 1948
Inspection Period—April 22 thru May 3

NO PRIORITIES NEEDED Hr ★  *
★ ★ ★ A N Y O N E  CAN B U Y !
Vi ax Assets Administration Location Sales are designed to meet 
the approval of the general public. Sales procedure is simple, as 
no unnecessary red tape is Involved. All you have to do is be pres­
ent the day of the Sale—Bid on the various buildings or building 
you desire, and li ygu are the successful bidder, title will be con­
veyed “then and there.” Buyers may move buildings from site the 
day of Sale.
Now is the time of year to build and repair—and with the use of 
war surplus housing it is economical beyond compare. Some of 
the buildings may be moved intact, others will have to be disman­
tled—but there are unlimited possibilities as to their use. Recon­
version to homes, barns, garages, tool sheds and chicken houses 
are lust a few of the purposes to which other surplus buyers have 
made use of these types of buildings.
Types of buildings being offered In this sale include lavatories, 
post exchanges, hangars, recreation buildings, supply and rec­
reation. administration building, barracks, officer's quarters, ig­
loos and various other types.
Remember—You can inspect the buildings from 8:00 A. M. to 
4:00 P. M. any day excluding Saturdays and Sundays, from 
April 22 thru May 3.
Plan now to inspect the buildings and be at the Pampa Army 
Airfield. Pampa, Texas, to register for the sale between 8:00 
A. M. and 9:00 A. M. on May 4, 5 and 6. 1948.
All eales will be final, on an "as Is. where Is.” basis, subject 
to War Assets Administration Rules and Regulations and 
Terms and Conditions (4 Sale.
A list of buildings and copy of Sales Agreement may be ob­
tained on the Site, or by addressing the office shown below.

WAR A SSETS A D M IN ISTRA TIO N
OFFICE O F REAL P R O P E R T Y  D I S P O S A L -

GRAND PRAIRIE REGIONAL OFFICE 
REGION 7

P. O. BOX 6030 DALLAS X  TEXAS

The subject of the essays sub-

From where I sit... Joe Marsh

Homer Does Some 
"Back-Seat Sewing Iti

by, Monday, May 10, 1948.
“This contest should be par­

ticularly appealing to high school, 
college, and university students, 
and any others interested in win­
ning a 10-day vacation trip to 
Colorado’s mountains”, said Rob­
ert L. Hoyt, General Passenger 
Agent.

"All agents and representatives 
of these railroads will be in posi­
tion to answer questions. Anyone

ing
to

lives at an outlying 
address inquiries 
Fort Worth Club 
Worth 2, Texas,”

Drawing. Among
Joan Thompson's 

“Danney Hale” 
one of the ten 
Marsh, the 
ed hundreds of 
a high school 
don.

CO-OP TR
CONTROLLED: QUALITY —

The unusual lug design of this big 
tiro is what gives your tractors 
loss west# motion. Rrmly buttressed 
heavy undertreed, these doep 
lugs ere powerfully braced to aivo 
years of service. They bite in, they 
ahead, regardless of soil conditions.
Each lug meets the soil squarely, essurf 
full bite of tho treed from shoulde 
shoulder.
Scientific spacing end curvature of 
lugs forces mud end day out as the j 
turns. Mud pockets don’t form. Yoe 
positive traction in any type of soil.
Strong plies of powerful cord fabric 
this tire the inner strength to suppot 
massive lugs, tele punishing freer 
without weakening of the tire.

Donley County i

STUDY 
HAVE A

Ask for it 
trole-marks

BOTTLED UNDER AUTHORITY O f  THE COCA-COLA 

MEMPHIS COCA-COLA

I I
— ■*
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Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Ross and 
small daughter Jannie returned 
from a weeks visit in Kansas 
Tuesday. They also attended to 
business.

Skin Sufferers!
Stop Scratching! —  Try This

Distress of ugly pimples, rashes, itch- 
.ng, burning skin disorders resulting 
from external irritations can often he 
(illicitly relieved and cleanly healed by 
this simple inexpensive treatment.

Get a small bottleof Moone's Kinerald- 
Oil at any good drug store, t ’se at 
directed for 10 days Satisfaction guar 
anteed or money hack.

REXALL DRUG STORE

♦ LELIA LAKE ♦
♦ ♦
♦ Mrs. H. R. King ♦ 
♦ ♦ ♦ + + + ♦ ♦ + ♦ + + + + + +

C. L. Lewis returned last week 
from a business trip that look him 
to South Dakota.

Mr. and Mrs. O. L. Davis had 
business in Amarillo Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. E. J. Myers and 
children of Tulia spent the week 
end here and attended to business 
in Wellington.

Mrs. Edd Morton returned Sat­
urday from a short visit with 
relatives in Amarillo.

Donna Sue Morton of Los An­
geles recently arrived by plane to 
visit her grandparents, Mr. and

We Believe In the Best - - -
Yes, we believe in the best for our customers, 
and try to stock same.
•  TEXAS STATE CERTIFIED PLANTING 

SEED of All Kinds.
•  A Full and Complete Line of the Famous 

CHlC-O-LINE Mixed Feeds and our New 
WES-TEX Line of Mixed Feed.

Also - - -
SIMPSON'S SPECIAL DAIRY FEED, 

and a complete line of home grown grains 
and Chopped feed.

When we hear of a better feed, we will stock it. also. 
We give Green Stamps on Cash sales - - ask for them.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
Phone 149

Mrs. Edd Mortor., and other rela­
tives in Memphis.

O. L. Davis, W. R. Christal, J. 
L. Butler, and Rice Batson made 
a business trip to Childress last 
Tuesday.

Mrs. V. P. Darnell went to 
Amarillo Thursday to visit her 
brother, who is in a hospital 
there.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mooring are 
the proud parents of a son since 
last Thursday. The mother and 
baby are in a Memphis hospital.

Doris Robertson spent the week 
end in Amarillo with her mother, 
Mrs. R. L. Knall.

Mrs. Geneva Hinton, Mrs. J. L. 
Butler, Mrs. Mary Chenault, and 
Mrs. Wilma Batson attended an 
Eastern Star meeting in Welling­
ton last Tuesday evening. They 
accompanied Mr. and Mi’s. Will­
iams of the Naylor community.

Mr. and Mrs. Lamar Aten had 
for guests Sunday, Mr. and Mrs. 
Glenn Rutter of Hereford, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Mooney of Claren­
don, and Mr. and Mrs. Quinn 
Aten and Shirley.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Watson of 
Lockney spent the weekend with 
her parents, Supt. and Mrs. O. L.
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Mr. and Mrs. John Hansard and 
Judy of Lockney spent the week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. J. E. 
White.

Mr. and ' Mrs. Leroy Fox of 
Wichita Falls and Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Moreland of Clarendon 
spent the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Fox.

Mr. and Mrs. Jess White had 
for Sunday guests, Rev. Coving­
ton of Buffalo Springs, Mrs. Rey­
nolds and Mrs. Hall of Clarendon, 
Mr. and Mrs. d .  D. Seago, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. L. Butler, Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Myers and Mrs. W. L. Butler.

Mr. and :< u t. J. L. Butler and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Lee Butler 
had business in Amarillo Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. J. P. Reynolds and 
V. iley of Clovis. N. M. spent the 
weekend with relatives here.

We are sorry to report that Mr. 
Merrill died of a heart attack 
^'•"Hay evening. He had made his 
home with Mr. and Mrs. Wright 
ior many years.
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Mrs. Genera McCune who has 
been visiting her niece and fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Beard re­
turned to her home at Woodward, 
Okla. Sunday.

INSURANCE OF ALL KINDS—

ABSTRACTS OF TITLE

REAL ESTATE NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
C. C. POWELL

Phone 11 Clarendon

♦ MIDWAY *
♦ Mrs. John GoHston ♦
♦ > + + ■► + + + * ♦ ♦ ♦ ' • • * ■ ♦ 4

Rev. and Mrs. Hayne of Clar­
endon visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Romeo Derrick one day this past 
week. Mrs. Derrick was returned 
to her home Sunday, convalesc­
ing from the accident she suffered 
in the car wreck some time back. 
Other guests during the week 
were their sons Frank Derrick 
from Oxbow and Floyd from the 
McMurtry ranch, Mrs. Mary Har­
lan of Goodnight and Mrs. Potter 
of Clarendon, Mr. and Mrs. Clar­
ence Davis, Mr. and Mrs. Bank- 
head and children of Clarendon, 
and Mrs. John Goldston and son 
Vernon and Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Hermesmeyer and children.

Vivian Morrow and Nora Gold­
ston visited with Mrs. Glenn 
Williams Wednesday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Jones and 
Mrs. Jones of Clarendon went to 
Memphis Thursday.

Mrs. Edith Longan and aunt, 
Mrs. Lizzie Corder went to Ama­
rillo and visited relatives, return­
ing on Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. W. K. Hardin of 
Clarendon visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. Marvin Jones Monday night.

Ruth and Emiline Corder of 
Amarillo spent the weekend in 
the Longan home.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Davis of 
Plainview came over Saturday to 
visit in the home of his father, W. 
K. Davis. Kennedy returned 
home with them for a weeks visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Jones 
were dinner guests in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Wayne McElroy 
in Clarendon Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Davis 
visited with her mother, Mrs. 
Thornberry who is in the General 
Hospital in Wichita Falls, having 
undergone an operation.

Guests in the W. K. Davis home 
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. Elmo

Riley and Mr. and Mrs. Huey 
Cook of Shamrock, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jiggs Mosley of Borger, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Royce Davis and Wayne 
of Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Morrow 
and children were dinner guest 
in the Walter Morrow home Sun.

Wayne Morrow went on a fish­
ing trip to Buffalo Lake Monday, 
returning Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. T. G. Corbin of 
Dallas are visiting her brother, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Beard and 
family. Mr. Beard is confined to 
his bed from a heart attack Sat. 
morning. He is better at this 
time.

Ya kin git lonesome on th range fer 
another feller t’talk. to; but 

in town ya sometimes git 
lonesome fef yerself!

FOR FREE REM OVAL 
OF DEAD STOCK CALL

PHONE

5
CLARENDON

FAST SANITARY SERVICE

DR. J. W. EVANS
D E N T I S T  

Clarendon, Texas

—Office Hours—

9:00 a. m. to 5:00 p. m.

Quality Food Val ues
A T  R E A L  M O N E Y - S A V I N G  P R I C E S

THE PRESENT PRICES ARE CHANGING RAPIDLY. OUR PRICES WILL BE IN LINE.
CHOCOLATES £
Sunshine Assorted—1 Pound ^ ►9c [PEAS 1 3 C

Brim full—No. 2 Can

PICKLES 1
Linden's Old Fashion—Pint ®, 5 c BEETS 1 3 c

Libbya No. 2 Can *  ^
SAUCE 1
Leota Belle—14 os. Bottle ™, 3 c APRICOTS 2 3  c

Libbys, whole in heavy syrup—No. 2*/a Can

PUREX 2 7  c
Bleach and Cleanser (Disinfectant)— */a Gallon ™

TOMATO JUICE 1 O c

NAPKINS 2 5  c
Embossed (60 count)—2 Pltgs.....................................................

PRUNES 1 5 c
Del Monte in heavy syrup—No. 2Va Glass

NEVER BUY REAL ESTATE 
W ITHOUT AN ABSTRACT.

Donley County Abstract Company
C. E. KILLOUGH 

Phone 44

CLARENDON FINEST
HOMELIKE COMFORT ■ PRIVATE PARKING

Quality Meats
Try Our Baby Grain Fed Beef 

Xt'a Different

Hot Barbecue
POUND

50c
BEEF ROAST

GOOD CHOICE
POUND

MILK WHITE SWAN

6 Small Cans .29
Split Pgr Soup™— .27

SPECIALS IN OUR

DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT

49c
Dressed Hens

FRESH

POUND

47c

STRAW HATS—Boys, Girls, Ladies and Men!
Children’s Play Suits—Reg. $1.98 ... $1.49
Men’s Ranch Pants—10 oz.............. $2.98
CANNON TOWELS
Assorted colors (20 x 42)—2 for ................$1.15 E a c h ------ 59c
SHEETS
Pequot plus Service Muslin ($1 x 108)—2 sheets . . . .  $7.00 Each $3.79

FARMERS EXCHANGE
Phone 63-J GROCERY & MARKET We Deliver

BANANAS
POUND

15c
SPUDS

10 LBS.

59c
Cucumbers

FRESH
POUND

19c

THIS HOME IS DEDICATED TO THE MEMORY OF THOSE 
WHO IN ETERNAL SLEEP REPOSE HEREIN AND IS FOR 
THE USE AND COMFORT OF RELATIVES AND FRIENDS.

Womack Service Phone 94

Paint
WALLPAPER - CUSS

BUILDERS SUPPLIES

•  HARDWARE

•  PLUMBING

•  ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

•  APPLIANCES

•  FLOOR COVERING

•  GIFTS

•  SPORTING GOODS

Fishing Season is just around the 
comer. We Carry the Largest Stock
in this area.

"YOU ALWAYS SAVE AT THE”

PAINT STORE
k ; HUDSON & TAYLOR

Phone 115

CD

S>
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BUY NOW AND SAVE -  -  SALE ENDS SAT.. APR. 2 4

EXTRA LEAN

Sliced BACON
POUND

59c

S R . Grapefruit Juice
i 1 **o.  ̂Can* ................................ ! o

GRAPEFRUIT
Marsh Seedless—Dozen 35c
ORANGES
Texas—Dozen . 25c
CELERY
Large Crisp Stalk 19c

FRESH STRAWBERRIES

OLEO
MEADOLAKE

POUND

39c
SUGAR

PURE CANE 

10 LBS.

85c

ItsiikSO t
JKm
n r f r r u T

PALMOLIVE « «  1 7 c  
PALMOLIVE** <— >

M P E R aw sa28c

jSm 19C

sli§£
D I ?  A  C  •* *
J L  J j e / J L A . | 3  No. 2 Can 19

JELLO
2 for 19c PRESERVES

Pineapple—1 lb. Jar 25c
A

CANDY BARS
Hershay 5c PICKLES

Sour or Dill—Quart Jar 31c
MY-T-FINE
DESSERT. 6 Flavor*—3 for 25c ORANGE JUICE

Citra Gold, No. 2 Can*—3 for 25c
GRAPE JUICE
Welch'*—Quart 59c Apricot Nectar

a  os. Can .... 49c

PEARS No. 2Vi Can 40
5 P E RCE NT  
DI SCOUNT

I

on
CASE LOTS

GRAPEFRUIT JUICE
STOKELYS 

46 OZ. CAN

17c
PORK & BEANS

TALL CAN

14c

^  M S■r -  n
rfesB<>1 ,k*' ' mIsaPeaches30

1

PRESERVES
Stokley* Strawberry—1 lb. Jar ..

* C  1 co rn  19c
w  Stokley* Vac. Pack—12 os. C an.. ™

^JPRICOtS

A  •  No. 2V4 Cans | |A p riC O tS ::: 67
PRESERVES O*
Stokley* Apricot—1 lb. Jar

)c p ™ p 1 ® *  20c
w  Stokley*—No. 2*/4 Can

FROZEN FOODS

No. 2 Can
3 f o r ............... 57*

BACH

20c

FLOUR GOLD MEDAL

25 lb. Sack I.p9
CATSUP
14 os. Bottlo ..

CHIU SAUCE
14 os. B o t t lo .................... 28c

Beanee Weenee
JAR .................................

Vienna Sausage
OAN ............... ................ 19c

Clarendon Food Store
Phone 43 GROCERY & MARKET Phone St
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Mrs. J. C. Estlack. Society Editor 
Phono 455

MINICK—ANDERSON
Miss Dorothy Minick, daughter 

of Mr. and Mrs. C. J. Minick of 
Clarendon, and Mr. Lewis Ander­
son, son of Mr. and Mrs. W. L. 
Anderson of Weatherford, were 
united in marriage in an impres­
sive, double-ring ceremony at the 
home of Rev. and Mrs. W. E. 
Hamilton Monday afternoon, 
April 19, at 3:00 with Rev. Hamil­
ton officiating. Mrs. Bud Moore 
attended the bride as matron of 
honor, and Mr. Bud Moore served 
as best man.

The bride was stunning in a 
petite white waffle-weave pique 
street-length dress trimmed with 
net applique, and accented by 
white accessories. Her corsage 
was of pink talisman rose buds. 
For her going-awny ensemble, 
the bride chose » pink gabciuine 
suit and gray accessories.

Mrs. Moore was attired in a 
gray print crepe dress with white 
accessories. Her corsage was of 
white carnations. The bride’s

mother wore a sheer pink crepe 
dress with a corsage of white 
carnations.

Mrs. Anderson was a student in 
West Texa^ State Teacher’s Col­
lege in Canyon, and also attended 
Clarendon Jr. College. Mr. Ander­
son was graduated from Weather­
ford High School and served 22 
months in the armed forces, most 
of his service being in Korea.

The couple left on an extended 
honeymoon immediately follow­
ing the ceremony. They will visit 
scenes of interest through New 
and Old Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. Anderson will 
temporarily make their home in 
Weatherford until they ent^r col­
lege this fall.

PATHFINDER C^UB
The Pathfinder Club wiil meet 

Friday, April 23rd at 4 p. m.

Mrs. Dwight Blair and small 
daughter, Sharon visited in Mc­
Lean Friday night and Saturday.

SHOPPING l i s t
fOR HOIRlPIAKlRS
Y tu r R ix a ll Drug S ta rt (on satisfy n ta rly  
ovary Shopping l is t  w ith Quality M trchand itt.

CASCAtl 
WRITING PAN!
30 ihMH hi
popularly p*ktd pork**.

10c
•ft MTiMAiit m u m n

CASCAII
HAITI MVUOPIS
14 «Mt« Kn«fi •nvatoeM 
b car***«l*nl ha»« pk#.

10c

H I  
TKNNIS BAUI
3 boili In hermetically 
leoled He let treihneu.

EVERYDAY NEEDS PRICED LOW

1 £

GYPSY CHAM
Tokei the "bvrn" awl of 
tun at windburnl Quick* 
drying lotion.

*1  M i S O C

RIXALL 
ilOMRANT

<eetbleetlen 4 o t. Oolnty 
■Oeedereet Few derl 7 es. 
■eioH liquid Deodorant.
70# Vehte. Q p c
BOTH FOR

KLENZO ANTISEPTIC
The cinnamon.tpicy onfi- 
septic I hoi kills contoctad 
germ*.ralrathas A 
Ihe mouth . . . .  QJFC

At Ca«ae* ttom Sut|«t H PadsNl too

RIXALL 
MSI 
ANTISEPTIC
H yoieek  mevth w aih . 
M b  con to rted  te rm s.

i d . o t  .  6  9 e

INSECTICIDE
Contain, J%  DOT. Mb

M A Y  2 2  TO 2 9  IS  N A T IO N A L  FOOT N i A L T N  W F F K

Rexall Drug

ASHTOLA NEEDLE CLUB
The Ashtola Needle Club met 

Thursday, April 15 at 2 o’clock in 
the Clubroom with Mary Belle 
DeBord, the president, in the 
chair. Roll call was answered by 
“My Favorite Flower.”

Vena Hudson read a paper on 
flowers and landscaping. A num­
ber of bulbs, plants and shrubs 
were exchanged. Mrs. Lillie Knox 
and Miss Marvis Hudson were 
welcomed as visitors.

Marcella Lovell and Nona Hin­
ders, hostesses, served delicious 
cake and punch to two guests and 
the following members: Mesdam- 
es Vena Hudson, Ima Wallace, 
Elizabeth Graham, Myrtis Will­
iams, Mary Henderson, Dora 
Brandon, Ruby White, Sue 
Rhoades, Mary Belle DeBord, 
Viola Graham, Hazel Brandon 
and Johnie Poovey.

Polly-Anna gifts were exchang­
ed. After a successful business 
and social hour, the club adjourn­
ed to meet May 6th with Jo Harp 
and Elizabeth Graham as hostess­
es.

Let each member who has 
plants, seeds and shrubbery for 
exchange, bring them as that day 
will be our last plant exchange.

—Reporter.
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CLARENDON H. D. CLUB

Mrs. Clyde Butler entertained 
the club at her home Friday in 
covered dish luncheon and quilt­
ing. The guest rooms were decor­
ated in bowls and vases of lilacs 
and wisteria blossoms. A club 
quilt was quilted. At the noon 
hour, a delicious and bountiful 
luncheon was served family style 
at the large table.

At 3 p. m. the business meeting 
was presided over by the presi­
dent, Mrs. Anderson. Guest pres­
ent was Mrs. Mattie Manning of 
Amarillo; club members were 
Mesdames G. A. Anderson. A. L. 
Chase, Claude Darden, J. C. Est­
lack, M. C. Rampy, Laura Taylor, 
H. B. Hill, William Payne.

The club will meet with Mrs. 
Chase on May 21.

MARTIN QUILTING CLUB
The Martin Quilting Club met 

Thursday April 15 with Lois Sib­
ley in an all day quilting. A de­
licious luncheon was served at the 
noon hour. There were 24 present. 
Two quilts were quilted on by 
guests, Mrs. Lacey of California, 
Mrs. Julia Waethter, Mrs. J. T. 
Watt, Mrs. Ray Robertson of 
Pampa, Mrs. Roberta Pittman of 
Clarendon, Alice Pittman, Bess 
Green, Velma Hearn, Lavoris Mc- 
Gough; members, Sela Bulman, 
Billie Barbee, Lizzie Morrow, 
Gracie Crofford, Nola Hill, Mar­
garet Waldrop, Blanche Higgins, 
Helen Land, Fannie Wilson, Sallie 
Christie, Eunice Land, Wyvonne 
Barker, Ruby Fitzgerald, Ruby 
Jordan, Bessie Helton and the 
hostess, Lois Sibley.

Anna Waldrop, Lois Sibley and 
Blanche Higgins all received 
Pollyanna gifts. Mrs. Wacchter 
gave a demonstration. Next meet­
ing will be with Margaret Wald­
rop on April 29th in the home of 
her mother, Mrs. W. D. Higgins.

—Club Reporter.

KILL KARE KNEEDLE KLUB
lifrs. Mulkey entertained this 

club at herTiome Thursday after 
noon, April 8th. The guests rooms 
were decorated beautifully with 
Japonica blossoms. The usual 
needle work and pleasant conver­
sation were the main feature of 
the afternoon.

A lovely plate refreshment was 
served to Mesdames F. A. White 
Sr., R. R. Dawkins, J. R. Bartlett, 
H. C. Brum ley, Sam Lowe, Gene 
Noland, Clarence Piercy, Eva 
Draffin, Misses Etta and Ida 
Hamed and hostess, Mrs. Mulkey.

The next meeting will be with 
the Hamed sisters, April 22.

CUE AND CURTAIN CLUB
The Cue and Curtain Club met 

in the home of Ann Thompson 
April 19. A club constitution was 
presented and adopted. Ann 
Thompson presented an interest­
ing speech on ‘The History of the 
Theater.”

Refreshments of open-faced 
sandwiches, cookies and cokes 
were served to 21 members.

Mrs. Pat Slavin is visiting her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. L. E. Davis 
at Lubbock this week.
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BUSINESS WOMENS CIRCLE
The Busings Women’s Circle 

of the Fii'st Baptist Church met 
in the home of Hazel Bingham 
Tuesday evening. Miss Jessie 
Cook, teacher, presented the 
mission study for the evening.

The following members were 
present: Miss Jessie Cook, Mari 
Rhode, Jackie Phelps, Jenny 
Whitsell, Eva McJunkin, Joyce 
Jacobs, Lee Tyler, Juanita Vau­
ghn, and Hazel Bingham. New 
members were Virginia Mooney, 
Mary Williams, Melba Risley and 
Billy Beard.

The next meeting will be held 
at the church on May 11, with 
Joyce Jacobs and Jackie Phelps 
hostesses.

GOLDSTON QUILTING CLUB
The club met Wednesday even­

ing with Mrs. Eddie Reynolds.
Guests present were Velma 

Owens of Clarendon and Martell 
Webb of Hudgins. Members pres­
ent were Mesdames Ella Reynolds 
Connie Talley, Ruth Littlefield, 
Flossie Reynolds, Francis Ford, 
Sarah Peggram, Nora Smith, Ida 
Stewart, Joy Roberson, Mazie 
Eichelbergcr, Nina Dale, Ola Mc- 
Brayer, Margaret Lemons, Miss 
Nora Jackson and the hostess, 
Charlene Reynolds.

The next quilting will be at the 
home of Nina Dale, April 28th.

Mr. and Mrs. R. P. Wilson have 
returned homedfrom a visit with 
their son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Wilson and new grandson at 
Lubbock, Texas.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Goldston are 
in Waco this week attending the 
State Congress of Optometry/

Mr. and Mrs. R. S. Brum ley 
and Shirley and Mr. and Mrs. 
Elba Ballew and Elba Jean at­
tended the rodeo celebration at 
Canyon last Saturday.

Mrs. J. L. McMurtry and Mrs. 
Ray Palmer visited in Amarillo 
Monday.

Mrs. Terrell Trussell is serious­
ly ill in the Goodall hospital at 
Memphis.

Mrs. Carl Tyree and Mrs. Luc­
ian Bones were in Clarendon last 
week visiting relatives and at­
tending to business.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Riley visit­
ed relatives near Canyon the 
weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Whitlock 
visited their sons and family at 
Amarillo Tuesday and Wed.

Mr. and Mrs. Horace Green and 
John Miller Morris visited rela­
tives at Jacksboro the weekend.

Political
Announcements
Political announcements ap­

pearing in this column are sub­
ject to the action of the Demo­
cratic primary in July. All an­
nouncement fees must be paid in 
advance.

State Representative.
122nd Judicial District:

GRAINGER MelLHANY 
CARL B. MORRIS 
VINCENT KERSEY

District Judge,
100th Judicial District:

LUTHER GRIBBLE

District Attorney for the 
100th Judicial District:

LEONARD KING

County Judge:
W. J. WILLIAMS 
TOM F. CONNALLY

County and District Clerk:
WALKER LANE

County School Superintendent:
RUTH M. RICHERSON 
O. L. DAVIS

County Treasurer:
MRS. TOM CRABTREE

Sheriff, Assessor & Collector:
GUY WRIGHT

County Commissioner,
Precinct No. 1:

J. S. (Sam) DALE 
RICHARD (Dick) CANNON 

Precinct No. 2:
J. R. BULLS 
W. D. SHELTON 
CECIL THOMAS 
R. O. (Dick) THOMAS 

Precinct No. 3:
F. M. MURRAY 
HENRY MOORE 
JOHN W. SWINNEY 

Precinct No. 4:
GEORGE PRESTON

JUNIOR SENIOR BANQUET 
HELD FRIDAY EVENING 
APRIL SIXTEENTH

Friday evening at seven thirty, 
the basement of the First Christ­
ian Church was the scene of a 
beautiful, gay Hawaiian garden. 
The Junior-Seqior Banquet was 
the occasion at which time the 
members of the Senior class were 
being entertained by the members 
of the Junior class. The Hawaiian 
motiff was carried on throughout 
the banquet and the dance after­
wards in the Opera House. Palm 
trees outlined the edges of the 
garden; silvery stars shone over­
head and lighted Japanese lant­
erns burned throughout the eve­
ning. As the guests entered the 
door, the serving girls formed an 
arch with palm branches and pre­
sented each one with a colored 
Hawaiian lei.

With Buster Bain, president of 
the Junior class, ns an able toast­
master, the program proceeded as 
follows:

Invocation—Rev. Warrin Fry.
The Product* of the Islands— 

Ladelle Cex.
Hawaiian Melody — Serving 

girls: Elba Jean Ballew, Louise 
Swint, Lois Marie Hommcl, 
Frankye Wilson.

The Mother Country — Mae 
Morris.

The Islanders—Mr. Drennan.
Volcanic Eruptions — J a n e  

Johnson.
Hawaiian Breezes—Rev. R. C. 

Bolton.
Exploring the Islands — Ruth 

Drake Jackson.
The banquet was served by the 

ladies- of the Win-A-Couple Class 
of the First Christian Church and 
the menu was as follows:

Papaya Cocktail 
Hawaiian Pineapple Salad

Chicken a la King in Baskets 
Green Beans Carrots

Star Beets Buttered Rolls 
Iced Tea

Paradise Pudding 
Mints

Girls from the Sophomore 
class, dressed in black skirts with 
white peasant blouses, zombias 
and a lei acted as serving girls. 
They were Elba Jean Ballew, 
Dorothy Bennett, Helen Swint, 
Lois Marie Hummel, Doris Jean 
Wallace, Ann Thompson, Bonnie 
Faye Allen, Frankye Wilson, Mar­
gie Phillips, Frankie Smith, Doro­
thy Lou Brock, Billy June Casey, 
Doris Tims, Betty Lou Craig, 
Reba Wade, Evone Heathington 
and Jo Ellen McGowan.

After the banquet a dance in 
the Opera House was enjoyed by 
everyone present. As the guests 
arrived at-thc top of the stairs 
they werq greeted by crepe paper 
streamers, and the word "Aloha” 
which was strung across the door. 
A giant balloon bag and confetti 
serpentines made the event gayer. 
Japanese lanterns covered the 
light in the dance hall also.

Many beautuul dresses and 
corsages worn by attractive 
young ladies were seen at this 
banquet. Ruffles, bustles, hoop- 
skirts, and off-shoulder dresses 
were the most used styles. The 
old-fashioned type of dress were 
the ones most seen in this Ha­
waiian garden, and proved to be 
very charming. Even the young 
gentlemen present were dressed 
in their best “bib and tucker” 
with many white carnations in 
their lapels.

Mrs. Bradshaw and sons Dug- 
las and Denny spent the weekend 
at Hereford with her mother, Mrs. 
B. R. Flowers. Mrs. Flowers re­
turned home with her for a visit.

Justice of the Peace. 
Precinct No. 2:

G. A. ANDERSON

Mr. and Mrs. Marivn Land and 
son Tommy of Tucumcari, N. M. 
spent the weekend with his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Land.

Mr. and Mrs. C. B. Morris vis 
ited in Amarillo Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Bingham 
visited her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
W. W. Rudd at Gainsville last 
weekend.

Mrs. Laura Taylor and daugh­
ter, Mrs. Henry Tatum visited 
her daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Lister 
at Borger Sunday.

Mrs. Mattie Manning who visit­
ed her sister, Mrs. J. C. Estlack 
the past week, returned to her 
home at Amarillo Wednesday.

sweeping the nation!

Newspaper Man Has Hard Life
I don’t know of any profession 

or trade that comes in for more 
enthusiastic criticism than news­
paper men. They are always 
treading on someone’s corns. One 
week when a Nevada editor was 
hard up for matter with which to 
fill his column, he set the Ten 
Commandments and printed them 
without editorial comment. After 
his paper was mailed he received 
a letter: ‘‘Cancel my subscription. 
You are getting too personal.”

Donley County Ludsr. $2.50 you

supersonic
PERMANENT WAVE -

The most scientifically perfect, 
electronically-controlled wave. Try it 

today for the thrill of a lifetime.

call Jor an appointment toJay
$70 - $75 • $20

Saye’* Beauty Shop
Phone 88 for appointment

COFFEE 3 9 c
Bright & Early—1 lb. Pkg.............................

PRUNEJUiCE 2 9  c
Dal Monta—Quart Bottla ......................‘ ..

Houaa of Wallaca— 12 os. B o t t la ................. ..................9c

ORANGES
Taxas—5 lb. B a g ..........................................

FLOUR”  C Q p
Light Crust—5 lbs.......................................**

SPUDS
Colorado Rada— 10 lbs. ........................

KRAUT I Q r
Madina—No. 2Vi Can ............................,
.............................................................................  w e g *  .

FROZEN FOODS

CLIFFORD &
GROCERIES A MEATS

Cold Storage Locker Service in Coimsallen 
Phone 5 Wa Deliver

SPECIALS
For FRIDAY & SATURDAY

CORN
May-Field, No. 2 Cana—3 for 5C>c
PEANUT BUTTER
Marco—Quart J a r .................. ....................

in >c
CATSUP 2 1
Brimfull—14 oz. Bottla ................................ c
TOASTS 2 9
Large B o x .......................... >c
PEAS 35
Tandarsweat, No. 2 Cana—2 f o r ................

6 for ..... ...................................................... .......... .. •
\c

$1.00

GRAPEFRUIT
Ruby Rada, Larga aiza—Dozan 50c

ONION PUNTS and SEED POTATOES
SYRUP
Varmont Maid—12 os. Jug 29c
CAKE-0-FRU1T
Merchants—15 oz. Size . . . 23c

PAPER TOWELS
Roll 19c

Shop our market for the finest in Extra fancy grain fad Baby Baaf. It's 
juicy, tender and delicious.

SPINACH
Hearts Delight, fancy Calif, No. 21/2 Cana—2 f o r ......................

BEANS 2 5 c
Kimball's Mexican Style, 15 Vi oz. Cana—2 f o r .........................

Fryers, Youngbloods choice cuts, ready to fry.
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F O R  S A L E
FOR SALE — Roll-away bed; 

kitchen cabinet; ice box; rug. 
Phone 268-M. (11-p)

PINK-EYE SPRAY—Cutters new 
liquid Trisulfanol clears up 
most cases of pink-eye after one 
or two treatments. Get Cutter’s 
Pink-eye liquid spray at 

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE—Storm proof cotton 

seed for machine gathering 
Price $2.50 bushel. E. S. Ballew 
Phone 925-F3. (9-4c)

BETTER MUSIC—Famous Black- 
Diamond instrument strings in 
sets for Violin, Mandolin, Gui 
tar, Ukulele Sc Banjo. For sale 
at

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE—8 piece dining room 

suite. 2 square end tables. In­
quire at Shaver’s Army-Navy 
Store. (11-p)

FOR SALE—F-12 Farmall Trac- 
tor with full equipment. In 
good condition. Contact E. B. 
Allen 15 miles west of Claren­

don on the Amarillo highway.
(10-p)

V. F. W. Auxiliary raffling of a 
Floor Lamp, Saturday, May 1, 
at Household Supply Co. (11-p)

FOR SALE—Johnson Grass Seed 
can be bought at Rundell Sc 
Estlack or call Harry Franks at 
27-W, McLean, Texas. (11-p)

RETONGA —■ Famous stomach 
tonic for men and women. 
Retone with RETONGA. Get 
RETONGA at

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE or TRADE—1^ ton 

Ford truck, would like to trade 
for Farmall Tractor. May be 
seen at Clarendon Motor Co. 
See H. T. Warner, Phone 317.

(10-p)
FOR SALE — Cedar Posts. See 

Frank Hommel. (7-3c)

GRASS SEED—Get Extra Fancy 
Bermuda Grass seed at 

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE—Five filly colts, one 
half Arabian. Call 426. (10-p)

INFECTIOUS CALF SCOURS— 
Vaccinate new-born calves with 
GLOBE Bacterin as prevention 
measure. “Don’t Wait - Vacci­
nate!”

Stocking's Drug Store
(Cattle supplies since 1885)

FOR SALE — Late model Olds- 
mobile. Inquire at Leader of­
fice. (ltfc)

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER
PLANTS for SALE — Will have 

plants of all kinds this year. 
Potatoes, tomatoes, onions, cab­
bage, peppers, eggplants and 
collards. Ready in April. Boyd 
& Sons, located 2 blocks north 
of Johnson Machine Shop on 
west side of road. (7tfc)

-Thursday, April 22, 1948

MITES. BLUEBUGS. TERMITES 
E a s i l y  Exterminated with 
AVENARIUS C A R B O L I N -  
EUM. Buy it at

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE—M&M 2 row fertili­

zer attachment, slightly used. 
Frank Hardin. (10-3c)

SWINE — Eliminate worms from 
pigs and grown hogs by feed­
ing a small amount of GLOBR 
PHENOTHIAZINE in the regu­
lar feed.

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE—Red top cane seed, 

free of Johnson crass, grown 
from certified seed. Frank 
Hardin. (lOtfc)

FOR SALE — 100 bushel second 
year Delta Cotton seed. See Ed 
Wheeler 1 mile north of Ash- 
tola. (10-p)

SPRING VALUES AT 
WHITE AUTO STORE

Garden Hoe ......................... 89c
14 inch Rake ....................... 98c
Rubber tired Lawn Mowers—

5 cutter Bars ..............  $19.95
25 ft. Garden H ose............. $3.49
Random length Hose 11c per ft.
Electric Irons .....................  $3.95
Coupe Scat C overs......................  $5.95
Sedan Seat Covers ......... $9.95

Cushions vacuumed cleaned 
and Installed Free

Outing Jugs .......................  $2.89
2 gallon Water Cans .......  $1.25'
Electric Waffle Iron .......... $6.95
Electrtic Toasters ..............  $3.95
Grease Guns ......................$3.39
13 pc. M  inch Drive Socket Set 

with Ratchet and Swing head
handle............................  $7.45

Guaranteed Fan Belts .......  69c
4 Mallet Croquet S e t ........... $5.95
All metal Sun Visor ...........$14.95

Whites Super Battery 
18 mo. written guarantee 
Only .......  $10.95 Ex.

Whit* Auto Store 
Phone 162

KILL BORERS in SHADE 
TREES—Hedges and lawn trees 
grow more foliage when free 
from Borers. Get BORER- 
KILLER at

Stocking's Drug Store

CATTLE— Protect your cattle 
from blackleg, Secpticemia and 
other mixed infections with the 
SAFER, SURER and LARGER 
doses of the more potent 
GLOBE BACTERINS Sc VAC 
CINES.

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE — Nice fat Fryers, 
$1.00 each. Mrs. Tom Crabtree.

(11-p)
T O N I  H O M E  PERMANENT 

SETS with professional Type 
Plastic Curlers. Buy Toni Sets 
at

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE — House 

Mrs. E. M. Ozier.
and barn.

(8tfc)
BULK SULPHUR and BULK 

COPPERAS.
Stocking's Drug Store

NITRAGIN — Treat garden and 
field seed with Nitragin. It re­
stores and Maintains soil fertil­
ity and increases yield. Get it at 

Stocking's Drug Store
COWLEY’S RAT Sc MOUSE EX­

TERMINATOR—Wipe out mice 
and rats with a single bait set­
ting. The original liquid rat 
poison. Get it at

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE—75 lb. Ice Box and 
MW table model Cream Separa­

tor. See G. W. Wood. Phone 
419-R. (10-p)

WATERMELON SEED — Yellow 
Meat Tender-Sweet, Black Dia­
mond and Blue Rind Water­
melon seed in bulk at 

Stocking's Drug Store
MILK FEVER—If your milk cow 

is exhausted and down after 
calving try Calcium Gluconate 
with Dextrose for immediate 
relief. Get it fresh from 

Stocking's Drug Store

FOR SALE—Good small kitchen 
sink. Call 120-W. Mrs. Joe Ray.

(10-c)
FOR SALE—12 x 24 house, 3 reg­

istered shoats. Dewey Myers, 
Brice, Texas. (12-p)

Whites Cordovan Deluxe Tires, 
25000 mile unconditional guaran­
tee; 24 months if speedomter is
broken—O n ly__ $14.93 tax Pd.

White Auto Store 
Phone 162

FOR SALE — All kinds used 
Lumber; doors, windows and 
everything complete; also good 
house for sale. John S. Morgan.

(9tfc)
RATTLESNAKE BITE! Carry a 

snake bite suction kit for your 
protection—plus spares for car, 
cabin; hunting and fishing 
trips. It is quick effective treat­
ment.

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE—Good used Lumber 

also some new lumber. See 
Roxie Wyninegar at Roxie’ 
Cafe, Hedley, Texas or phone 
165, Hedley. 10-c)

CHICKEN HEALTH — Use Dr. 
Salsbury’s Ren-o-sol in drink­
ing water for baby chicks. It’s 
a tonic starter and prevents 
Coccidiosis. Get Ren-O-Sol at 

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE — 19 Jersey heavy 

springers, both cows and 
heifers; 3 Jersey cows now 
fresh with baby heifer calves. 
See Ross Darby, 1 mile north 
of Clarendon, Donley County.

• (10-p)
DISTEMPER — Treat Distemper 

in horses with Globe Bacterin. 
It helps prevent the disease and 
aids in the recovery. Get it at 

Stocking's Drug Store
FOR SALE—One regular Farm- 

all, fully equipped with power 
lift; one F-12 Farmall fully 
equipped; 1940 Plymouth; 1936 
Buick. H. T. Bobbitt. Phone 
410-R. ‘ (11-p)

Clarendon, April 29-30 -  May 1st

PLUNKETT’S BIG

Stage Show
LOT SOUTH OF PIGGLY WIGGLY

30 People on The Stage— In Person

GARDEN SEED—Certified Bulk 
Garden Seed in wide variety 
from America’s finest growers 
at

\  Stocking's Drag Store

IN OUR BIG TENT!
Comedy — Plays — Vaudeville Galore

-------- Featuring The--------

I PLUNKETT BROTHERS 
i AND SISTERS

Capt. Plunkett and his Trained Seals, Dogs and Monkeys

Texas* Largest Tented Stage Show
SPONSORED BY V, F. W .

COMFORTABLE SEATS TOR 1200 PEOPLE

A D M I S S I O N
Children 25c -  Adults 50c (Inch Tax)

Doors Open • 7:15— Curtain at 8:00 
CHANGE OF PROGRAM EACH NIGHT 

Slight Extra Charge for Reserved Seats—25c tax included

TRACTOR MAGNETOES 
Factory Authorised 

Sales & Service 
HOMER BONES

(52tfc)
10% RESIDUAL D.D.T. Spray is 

best for cockroaches and other 
creeping insects. Get it at 

Stocl tag's Drug Storo
FOR SALE — Fryers now ready. 

L. T. Mays on old Jericho high­
way at old Summers place.

(11-p)
VIGORO — Vigoro in bags from 

5 lbs. to 100 lk. sacks. Get 
Vigoro at

Stocking* s Drug Storo

FOR SALE — 39 Deluxe Ford 
Sedan. Joe HalL (9-2e)

AVON PRODUCTS will train 2 
women to service good territor­
ies in Clarendon. Earn while 
you learn. Pleasant, Profitable, 
permanent. F. Watson, Avon 
Dist. Mgr., Box 1054, Amarillo, 
Texas. (9-2c)

KILL Weeds—Spray ugly weeds 
away. Magic Weed Killer kills 
roots and all; no injury to the 
grass. Get Magic Weed Killer at 

Stocking's Drug Storo
FOR SALE — 2 Wetmore Feed 

Mills, one Clipper and one 
Glutton. Both good shape. M. B. 
Eiland, l 1* miles east of Good­
night. (10-p)

W A N T E D

EGG and MILK PRODUCTION— 
Step up egg and milk produc­
tion by feeding Dr. LeGear’s 
Improved Poultry Prescription 
or Cow Prescription. Get it 
fresh at

Stocking's Drug Storo
FOR SALE—Half Sc Half Cotton 

Seed, second year seed. Run­
dell A Estlack, phone 262, Clar­
endon, Texas. (lOtfc)

SICK ROOM NEEDS—Bed pans. 
Urinals, invalid rings and all 
other sick room needs when 
you need them at

Stocking's Drug Storo 
(Since 1885)

FOR SALE—800 lbs. used barbed 
wire 5c lb. 90 posts 30c each. 
See D. B. Perdue. (10-p)

FOR SALE—Clean ’39 Plymouth 
coupe, radio and heater. Phone 
272-R. (9-p)

FOR SALE — House with five 
rooms and bath—foundation for 
another room, also garage. 
Handy location across street 
from jail. Phone 272-R. (9-p)

WANTED—Ironing at my home. 
Mrs. W. E. Hastings. (9-2c)

WANTED—Sewing to do. Mrs. 
M E. King. 2nd house from 
Mooney building. (11-p)

WANTED—Woman to do general 
house work, permanent job for 
right party. Mrs. Floyd Wilson, 
Claude, Texas. (10-p)

Will do Ironing in home or keep 
children. Second house east of 
football park, on west 3rd. Mrs. 
Bill Craig. (10-p)

MALE HELP WANTED
Reliable man with car wanted to 

call on farmers in Donley 
County. Wonderful opportun­
ity. $15 to $20 in a day. No ex­
perience or capital required. 
Permanent. Write today. Mc- 
NESS COMPANY, Dept. A, 
Freeport, 111. (10-p)

WANTED — Sewing to do. For 
pick-up and delivery on two or 
more garments call 353-W. Mrs. 
John Lemons. (10-p)

WANTED — will pay 90c per 
hundred for Scrap Iron. Deliver 
to Smith Gin. Jerome Price.

(12-p)

ARMY & NAVY STORE
ARMY FIELD SHOES — NAVY OXFORDS 

TARPOLINS — ARM YCOTS — SLEEPING BAGS 
COWBOY SHOP MADE BOOTS — Childrens BOOTS 

NEW ARMY KHAKI SHIRTS and PANTS

SUITS MADE TO YOUR MEASURE

T. M. SHAVER
Located first door South of Hoath Motor Co.

UNCLE SAM’S PART OF 
TOUR TELEPHONE BILL

★

1C.

★

★

★

★

★

★

★

★

★

★

The Federal tax rate on local telephone service 
is 15%. The tax rate on long distance service, 
where the charge is 25c or over, is 25%. Other 
forms of telephone service are subject to Fed­
eral taxes at rates ranging from 8% to 25%. .

This tax is imposed by the U. S. Government 
directly on the user of the telephone. The tele­
phone company, at its own expense, serves as a 
collector.

Long distance calls and certain other serv­
ices, being taxed at 25%. are taxed higher than 
the 20% rate for luxuries such as furs, jewelry, 
and perfumes.

This form of tax, that ia ah excise tax on tele­
phone service, has traditionally been resorted to 
only in national emergsneies. Your telephone 
company believes this form of tax should not 
be a part of the peace time tax structure. Repre­
sentatives of the telephone industry have urged 
and will continue to urge before the proper 
Congressional committees diet these excise 
taxes now be eliminated; and many users and 
representatives of users of telephone service 
are likewise urging that they be repealed by the 
tax legislation now before the Congress,

★

★

★

★

★

★

★

★

★

★  *

SOUTHWESTERN ASSOCIATED 
TELEPHONE CO.

*  ★  ★  ★  ★  1

★

★

F O R  R E N T

Victory Courts, Clarendon, Texas 
has one air conditioned, well 
furnished apartment for rent, 
either by week or month. See 
C. W. Winchester, owner. (10-c)

FOR RENT — Smau furnished 
apartment. See Mrs. J. A. 
Warren or phone 152-W. (10-c)

FOR RENT — Large front bed­
room with kitchen privileges, 
near business district. Middle 
aged woman preferred, will 
consider couple. Mrs. D. W. 
Clampitt. (8tfc)

FOR RENT — Furnished apart­
ment. Mrs. E. M. Ozier. (8tfc)

ladies wrist watch in vicinity 
of Kemp Machinery Co. Re­
ward. Return to Carroll Deahl, 
Phone 68, Hedley, Texas or to 
the Leader office. (11-p)

DR. H. R. BECK
D E N T I S T
Goldston Bldg.

Clarendon, Texas Phono 48

MISCELLANEOUS

TZdUvc SORE. ACHING
'W tu A c le A  q l t f l

Tm% t #
Need a home in the country for a 

half collie pup, about 8 mos. 
old. Call Doc Shoffitt. (10-p)

WARREN • CHENAULT 
Income Tax Service

Offices: 209 Goldston Building 
m Clarenduu, Texas 

J. A. Warren E. J. Chenault.

L O S T  & F O U  N D

h y

LOST — White Gold Banner

W J H

P enetrating L in im ent
ASK YOUR D R U G G I S T

TO THE MUSIC OF

EVERETT BATTLES
AND HIS RHYTHM RAMBLERS

Who will appear in Person at the

CLARENDON OPERA HOUSE

Saturday, April 24th
Admission $1 per person 9 til - - ??

Don’t Forget to Attend
OUR FREE DEMONSTRATION 
Thursday, April 29th at 7:30 p. m.

For Freezing and Sub-Znro 
Storagg of Frozgn Foods
A triumph o f  engineering end research, 
bringing you valuable exclusive features 
found nowhere else . . .  so ste tte r hew 
mmeb ym  p a y ! Compare—and you’ll ba 
convinced: New ideas, new design, new 
quality construction make this the 
greatest freezer on the market 1

•T em peratu re*  to  13*.JV  
b e lo w  s e ro  fo r  * h e rp  
freeeiae.

•  Hold* 200 lb*, of food.
•  3 separate storage com* partinetH*. <
•  Warnine Bell wars* of 

failure in house cui 
Only Ptulco bus It!

•T em peratu re  co n tro l 
w ith b n ilt’in lock to 
p resen t tam pering.

•  Built-in Thermometer.
•H erm etically  Sealed 

Super Power System. No 
belts to replace.

M odel AH51

$249.50

RUNDELL & ESTLACK
YOUR LOCAL PHILCO DEALER

ALLIS-CHALMERS FARM MACHINERY
Phong 292 Clarendon, Texas
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FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
L. A. Sartain. Pastor 

J. M. Rampy. Music k Education
9:45—Sunday School

Alfred Estlack, Supt. 
11:00—Morning Worship.
7:00 p. m.—Training Union

U. Z. Patterson, Director 
8:00—Evening Worship 
4:00 p. m. Monday—Jr. G. A. 

meets.

6:30 p. m. Monday—Jr. and Int 
R. A. s meet.

3.00 p. m. Wednesday—W.M.S. 
8:00 p. m. Wednesday—Prayer 

service followed by Choir practice 
2:00 p. m. Thursday—Visitation 
7:30 p. m. Thursday—Men Visi­

tation.

FIRST METHODIST CHURCH 
Stanley W. Hayne. D. D„ Pastor
9:45 a. m.—Church School. 

Morning Worship—10:50.
Topic: "Spiritual Discernment” 
6:15 p. m. — Methodist Youth

AN IDEAL GIFT FOR

GRADUATION

... R AD lO 'S  
GREATEST VALUE!

PHILCO
A Great Performerl
Compare—for power, performance, price! 
Famed Philco "200” offers greatest value 
at lowest cost—with sensational AC-DC 
superheterodyne circuit, electro-dynamic 
speaker, built-in aerial—other outstand­
ing features! Rich tone, spariding clarity. 
Compactly cased in smart plastic cabinet. 
Come quick—before they're gooe!

N  •* w  Phi l co Rad i os  

a n d  P h o n o q r o p h i  

N o w  i n S t o c k  f or  

I m m e d i a t e  D e l i v e r y

RUNDELL & ESTLACK
YOUR LOCAL PHILCO DEALER

ALLIS-CHALMERS FARM MACHINERY
Phona 262 Clarendon. Texas

C h arte r No. M U Reserve D is tric t No. 11

REPORT OF CONDITION OF

THE FIRST NATIONAL BANK
O f CLARIN DON

IN  T H E  STATE O F TEX A S 

A t tbo Oooo of Busin*** on A pril I t ,  IM S

Published in rrspons*  to  call mud* bjr C om ptro ller of T he C urrency, 
nnder Section M U . U . 8. Revised S tatu te* .

ASSETS
Cash, balances w ith  o ther banks. Including reserve balance, and cash

item* In process of c o lle c tio n __ ____. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  . . . . .  1X71.CM.10
U nited  S tate* G overnm ent obligations, d irect and  g n arastco d  . . . . . . .  717.RPB.OO
O bligation* o f S tate* and political su b d iv is io n s______________ . . . . . . .  449.70
C orporate stocks (including  $2000.00 stock of Federal Reserve b a n k ) . .  X.*0 0.00
Loans and  d iscounts (including 9288 99 o v e rd ra fts)  _________ _______101,112.S4
Bank prem ises owned *39*0 00. fu rn itu re  and fix ture*  $000.00 ______ 4.2*0 00
O ther a s s e t s ------- ---- -----------------___________ _—-------------------------—. . .  09*.00

TO TA L ASSETS __________________________________________ $1,102.4*0.24

LIABILITIES
Demand deposits of individuals, p artnersh ip s, and  c o rp o ra t io n s__ ___1904,(S t.*9
Tune deposits o f individuals, partnership* , and c o rp o ra tio n * __ . . . ___ 0,440.0$
Deposit* of U nited  S ta tes G overnm ent (includ ing  postal sav ings) . . . .  I2.2C2.00
Deposits o f Slat** and political su b d iv is io n s --------- . . . . . . . . . _________22.MC.9C
Deposits of banks __________________________ ________________________ 22.C42.M
O ther deposits (certif ied  and cash ier's  checks, e tc .) 2,271.00

TO TA L D EPO SITS

TO TA L L IA B IL IT IE S  _________

999t,7CI.20

IP9S.70I.20

CAPITAL ACCOUNTS
C apital S to c k :

(C) Common stock, to ta l p a r 1*0,000.00 --------------------------------1 50,000 00
S u r p lu s_—------------------- ------------------------------- ----------------------------------- *0,200.00
Undivided p r o f i t s ---------. . . . . . . — . . —. . . . — . . . . . . . ----------------. . . . .  17.C10.04
Reserves (and  re tirem en t account for p referred  stock) --------------------- 0,000.00

TO TA L C A PIT A L  A C C O U N T * _______________ ____________ 1100,710.04
« ...

TO TA L L IA B IL IT IE S  AND C A PIT A L  A C C O U N T S ---------H .I02.4M .24

MEMORANDUM
A met* pledged o r assigned to  secure I lab ilities and  for o ther

purpoee* - —. . . . . . . . .  . . . . . . . .  —— — — — — — — — — — —----- •  70,000.00

S ta te  o f Texas. Coonty of Donley, se :
I, W. W. Taylor, cashier o f the  above-nam ed bank, do solem nly 

■ w ear th a t  th e  above s ta tem en t is tru e  to  th e  beet of my know ledge and  belief.

W. W . TAYLOR. Caahler.
CORRECT -A T T E S T  j 

ODOS CARAW AY
W. H. PA TRICK  D irectors.
R. L  PA TRICK

Sw orn to  and  subscribed before me th is  I5 ib  day of A prii, IM S.

(SEAL) i- T. PATMAN. Notary PubUa.

CD

Fellowship.
Evening Service—8:00 p. m. 
Service conducted by Methodist 

Youth Fellowship.
Wednesday — 7:30 p. m., Mid­

week Fellowship hour.

THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER

Ladies Bible study Wednesday 
at 3:30 p. m.

Mid-week Bible study, Wednes­
day at 8:00 p. m.

You are welcome to every ser­
vice.

PAGE SEVEN

PRE8B YTERIAN CHURCH 
Paul D. Wright, Pastor

Sunday School—9:45 a. m. 
Morning Worship Service — 

11:00 a. m.
Youth Fellowship—6:30 p. m. 
Evening Service—7:30 d . m .

ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST 
EPISCOPAL CHURCH 

Clarendon. Texas
The Rev. W. Warrm Fry 

Phone 276
Fourth Sunday after Easter—

4:30 p. m. Evening Prayer and 
Sermon.

Monday, April 26th,
St. Mark’s Day—

10 a. m. Holy Communion.

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
W. T. Hines. Minister

Bible School—10:00 a. m. 
Preaching—11 a. m. 8 i 7:45 p.m. 
Communion at 11:45 a. m. and 

8 p. m.

M E W S

N*. 141
O FFIC IA L STA TEM EN T OP 

FIN A N C IA L CONDITIO!*
• f  The

Donley County 
State Bank

AT CLARENDON. STATE OF TEXAS.
• t  the  close of bueint-** on the  12th day of 
A pril. I&4*. pu rsu an t to  call m ade by 
the  B anking Commi*eloner o f Texaa In 
accordance w ith the  B anking Lawa of thie 
S ta te .

RESOURCES

Loan* and  HI-count*. including 
overdraft*  (12.*80.22 CCC
Loan* I ................................................ IC4I.8IC.87
U nited  State* G overnm ent Obligation*, 
direct and guaran teed  . . . .. ..9 1 .0 7 0 .0 0 0 .0 0
Obligation* of (tn tea  and politi­
cal (ubdlvisiona . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  8,778.97
Cash, balance* due from  o th e r bank*, 
including renerve balance*, and ca*h 
Item* in proce** of collection (in ­
cluding exchange* fo r c learing
houael ..................................................  271.877.88
B anking houae, o r leasehold im ­
provem ent* . . . . . . . . . . . . _. . . . .  4.000.00
F u rn itu re , fixture*, and
equipment __ _________ . . . ____ 1.00

The War Assets Administration 
hoisted a stop sign at all surplus 
industrial real property installa­
tions this week. The freeze on 
this type of war surplus came as 
the result of a request by the 
joint army-naVy munitions board, 
which is engaged in reviewing the 
country’s defense requirements in 
case of a national emergency. The 
stop-sale order does not apply to 
personal property except certain 
machine tools and production 
equipment, and generally does 
not apply to non-industrial real 
property. This latter includes sur­
plus camp buildings sold for in­
dividuals to remove from the 
grounds and convert into homes 
or other needed housing. Indus­
trial plants in the process of be­
ing disposed of will be sold sub­
ject to a national security clause 
to enable the government to re- 
assuine ownership during a crisis. 
War Assets will continue to speed 
its job of selling out goods un­
needed by the federal govern­
ment while at the same time safe­
guarding facilities and property

essential to defense.

Next on the schedule of WAA’s 
surplus housing sales will be an 
offering of 207 Pampa Army Air­
field buildings. And people mak­
ing inspection of the buildings 
with an eye to future dwellings 
will be aided by a new WAA 
brochure containing scale-drawn 
floor plans for the low cost con­
version of barracks into two and 
three bedroom homes. These bro­
chures will be distributed at the 
Pampa field and are also avail­
able on request at the Grand 
Prairie regional office. Inspection 
for the Pampa sale will begin 
April 22 and continue through 
May 3. The spot bidding will take 
place May 4, 5 and 6 when the 
buildings will be awarded to 
buyers regardless of priority.

World War II veterans will get 
first crack at some choice surplus 
consumer goods during a War 
Assets clearance of Love Field, 
Dallas, on April 28, 29 and 30. 
Merchandise stored in Lockheed 
Hangar No. 1 includes cash reg­
isters, office desks, truck tires 
and nails among a variety of oth­
er equipment. The sale will be a 
combination fixed price and com­
petitive bid offering, with veter­
ans afforded to buy certain ar­
ticles on a rationed basis, and .the 
remainder open to all the priority

classes and non-priority buyers 
as arranged in 40 lots of related 
materials. The fixed price selling 
will be conducted April 28, and 
bids will be awarded on the lots 
through April 28, 29 and 30 ac­
cording to priority sequence.

One place where war surplus 
is being put to valuable, novel 
usage this month is the Veterans 
Administration hospital at Mc­
Kinney. War veterans now pat­
ients in the hospital there are fill­
ing their waking hours with radio 
listening over a unique three 
channel bedside hookup system, 
first of its kind in the country. 
Every piece of equipment used in 
this intricate hookup, with the 
exception of the central trans­
mitters, was salvaged from war 
surplus stocks. Headsets from

army tanks, air-ground systems 
used in the air forces and similar 
electronics instruments from al! 
parts of the country were furnish­
ed by the War Assets Adminis­
tration. Mr. Lou Finch of the 
Grand Prairie office’s priority 
claimants division assembled the 
needed supplies during four 
months of intensive search.

Another clearance of consumer 
goods, involving materials valued 
at $103,000, will be held at Camp 
Wallace near Galveston, on April 
28, 29 and 30. Gas ranges, dish­
washers, pillows, bathroom fix­
tures and beds and cots are some 
of the items to be sold. Inspection 
of the lots for all buyers will be 
held April 28. Veterans are invit­
ed to purchase during April 29, all 
other buying groups on April 30.

What Radio Repairs Cost!
• • That is something that you would like to know before 
you leave your radio to be repaired. We will be glad to 
give you a close estimate on the job. free of charge, be­
fore any work is done. Our service and parts are guar­
anteed, assuring you something for your money.

Complete service on all makes and model Radios.

CLACK RADIO SERVICE
Next Door to Thompson Bros. 

Clarendon, Texas Phone 119

T otal R t« o * rr ,i  . ___ 11,988.274.17
L IA B IL IT IE S  AND 

C A PIT A L ACCOUNT*

Common C apitol S to rk  ________I  *0,000.00
S u rp lu * : C ertified .......................... 28,000.00
Undivided profit* _____________  24.114.82
Demand deposit* of individual*, 
partnersh ip* . and corpora
lion* .....................................................1.6*8.824 5*
Tim e deposit* of individual*, 
partner*Rtp*. an d  corpora­
tion* _________   1,010.00
Public funds (Incl. U . S. Govt..
■late* and  political subdivis­
ion .) ...........................................  178.280.91
Deposit* o f bank* (excluding  re ­
ciprocal balance*) . . . . . . . -----  88.018.88
O ther deposit* (certified  A C ash ier’*
cheek*, e tc .) . . . . . . . —-------------  M ,787.88
Total a ll deposit* ..91,8M .0S(.48 
O ther liab ilities:

Reserve for
C o n tin g e n c ie s _____91.100.00

Reserve fo r Tax** — 104.17 1.204.17

PAYING TOP PRICE FOR EGGS 
YOU SAVE
EVERY DAY AT

A DANCING THRILL

T otal L iabilities and
C apital A reaent*  ____91.998.274.17

M EMORANDA
C ontingent L iab ilities:

Custom er'* securities held for 
safekeeping. Serie* " E "  Bond* 
held fo r sale under issuing 
agency agreem ent, etc. . . . —.  19,126.00

STATE O F TEXAS.
COUNTY O P DONLEY

I, W. C arro ll K norpp. being C ashier of 
the above named bank , do solem nly *wear 
th a t the  foregoing s ta tem en t of condition 
is tru e  to  the  beet of my knowledge sad  
belief.

W. CA RRO LL K N O RPP 
C ashier

CORRECT -A T T E S T :
W. J. Lewis
Wesley K norpp Director*
P. E. C ham berlain (Seal)

Subscribed and sw orn to before me thi* 
10th day of A pril. 1*48.

W A LTER B. K N O RPP. 
A N otary  Public in and  for Donley, 
County. Texaa.

H E N S IY
U N I ■

AND HIS

ORCHESTRA
WITH A HOST OF 

STARS

ALL IN PERSON

DANCE
W E L L I N G T O N , T E X A S

COMMUNITY BUILDING

LETTUCE
Crispy Firm—Head 10c
NEW SPUDS
3 lbc. 25c

PLENTY FRESH SQUASH, GREEN BEANS, 
ONIONS, EGG PLANTS,

CELERY, TOMATOES

FRESH STRAWBERRIES

Phon* 193 
WE DELIVER

Flour
GRAPEFRUIT
Texa*—7 for

YUKONS BEST 
25 lb. Sack $1.75

April 29th a-P in to  Beans
. .  r  .  e .  -  • !  2  l b c ..............................................

Dreft or Vel
AdmiMion $2.00 aach 
Sponsored by V.F.W.

Permanent Wave 
SPECIALS

MACHINE PERMANENTS

$3.50 to $7.50
COLD WAVE

NATIONALLY ADVERTISED 
PERMANENTS

Sugar
s r C A N o r . A k s  ^

SALAD DRESSING Q C
Bectyeit—Pint Jar .............................

CIGARETTES * 4  £ £
Carton ......................... .............  y  | a0 v

COFFEE J A
Admiration—Pound ...........................' I v V

SOAP—Box

CANE l l A  1 ^
10 lb. Sack .........................

PEACHES A A
Syrup Pack—No. 2 Vi C a n ..................4 tfC

PEARS o r
Syrup Pack—No. 2 Vi Can ...................V V V

ENGLISH PEAS A C
No. 2 Can—2 for .............................. L o C

GRAPEFRUIT JUICE 4 A
White Swan—46 os. C a n .................... I O C

In Our Modern Market
Pork Roast A R C  Hamburger 4 9 c
o M.nd Y O 0  W  MEAT_1 lb. " O n  w

SAYE’S BEAUTY SHOP
Phona 80

For Appointment

0LE0
Meadolake—1 lb.

3 9 c  Bulk Sausage
l Pound
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SOIL - - -
(Continued from Front page) 

Stewart and Ralph Porter.
Farmers and ranchers in Com­

munity “A” are already busy with 
carrying out good soil conserva­
tion practices under the 1948 
AAA Program. They, like farm­
ers all over the county, are aware 
of the need for improving and 
keeping the soil that they have on 
their farms.
_Five farmers: Murphy Brock.

owner of the place that C. H. 
Brock is operating; Roy Rober­
son; Jack C. Thomas, J. H. Ford’s 
landlord; W. L. Baker; and Fon- 
tayne Elmore are constructing 
large ridge type terraces on their 
farms. Together they will have 
more than eleven miles of new 
terraces built and paid for with 
AAA assistance.

C. J. Merrick, Roy Roberson, 
J. H. Ford, and Ralph Porter all 
have had n winter cover crop of 
Austrian Winter Peas planted on 
several aores of their farms. They 
have planted a total of 4000

MEAT
IN YOUR LOCKER 
HAS MANY ADVANTAGES
It Is economical, handy to get, you know exactly 
what you have as every item is labeled and dated, 
it's always fresh.

Hpee your Own MEAT when you want it. 
We still have a few lockers left.

; *xju }j» **

Donley County Consumers 
Frozen Food Lockers

Phone 192 Clarendon, Texas

pounds of Austrian Winter Peas 
on these farms. Ralph Porter also 
planted 450 pounds of Hairy 
Vetch.

Harvey Smith and his landlord, 
J. J. Helm, have seeded four 
kinds of grasses on 35 acres of old 
cropland that they are turning 
back to permanent pasture. The 
AAA assistance amounts to more 
than 50% of the cost of the seed. 
There are many acres of land in 
Donley County on which this 
practice should be carried out. 
Ralph Porter is improving the 
pasture he has with the seeding 
of lovegrass.

V. Littlefield has drilled a well 
on his range land with AAA as­
sistance. With the limited amount 
of funds available for assistance 
this year, the payment to a ranch­
er for this practice covers only 
about y< of the cost.

Other community “A" produc­
ers will take advantage of assist­
ance offered by AAA for good 
conservation practices during the 
year. There are 15 practices ap­
proved for the county. Commun­
ity “A” will have some farmer or 
rancher who will be interested in 
every one of those practices be­
fore this year is past. The AAA 
payments are made to assist any 
farmer or rancher who is inter­
ested in carrying out any good 
soil conservation practice. Though 
the payments are small they do 
go a long way toward correcting 
some of the major problems on in­
dividual farms.

Assistance under the program 
represents the interest and re­
sponsibility of all the people in 
the country in saving our soil. 
Divided among the 145 million 
people in the country the $150 
million for the 1948 program a- 
mounts to about $1 per person. 
And that dollar, together with the 
many dollars the farmer puts up 
is the food and security lifeline

W. T. HINES. Minister 
My lecture, "Why I Left Cathol­

icism" will ba delivered Wednes­
day night, April 28th at the 
Church of Christ meeting house, 
8:00 P. M. You are cordially in­
vited, and bring your friends.

W. T. Hines. Minister.

of the Nation.

Mrs. Collier of Hedley visited 
her daughter, Mrs. Neva Scott the 
weekend.

Mrs. Hazel Humphrey of Ama­
rillo visited Mrs. Eva Humphrey 
Sunday.

Trend For Dishes. Lingerie. 
Hosiery. Woolens 
2 Boxes ....... .33

VEL Save 10c—Redeem youi 
Coupons here.
Large Box ................ .35

15cBEETS
Nice Freeh—2 Bunches 

Pick-O-Morn—Every Tomato Guaranteed.

TOMATOES 2 8  c
Package .............................. W

rro |

LETTUCE I O C
Nice firm Head ™  ^

SUGAR PURE CANE 
10 lbs- .................... .85

Flour
PURASNOW g 
Mixing Bowl Free f 
25 l b s . ................................^(1.86

Tomato Juice
MARCO

46 OZ. CAN

23c
PEARS

HUNT'S Bartlett 
NO. 2Vt CAN

37c

WIENERS
Pound ................ 41c
Bacon Squares
Pound 45c
HAMBURGER
Pound ................................ 39c
PICNIC HAMS
Pound .................................. 47c

Shortening ARMOURS STAR 
3 lb. C arton .......... .99

M U L K E Y 
THEATRE

FRIDAY AND SATURDAY
WILLIAM ELLIOTT

—in—

“The Fabulous
T  99lexans

SUNDAY AND MONDAY

THE 
SEARING 

STORY 
OF THE 

TREASURY’S 
TOUGH 
GUYS

DENNIS O’KEEFE
•ilk Mary MEADE • AlfreM t Y l i t  • W*Hy 
FQI0 • Jwm KKKHAIT • CIm>I« McSUM

TUESDAY— -BARGAIN DAY
THE BOWERY BOYS

“Hard Boiled 
Mahoney99

WEDNESDAY —  THURSDAY 
FRIDAY

DENNIS MORGAN

“My Wild 
Irish Rose”

in Technicolor

Pastime Theatre
SATURDAY ONLY 

EDDIE DEAN

“Driftin' River”
in Color

___*

- d ........

<ii tnUk.1
m m m — t —-

YOU ARE INVITED
TO ATTEND OUR PHILC0

Home Freezer Demonstration
TO BE HELD IN OUR STORE

THURS., APRIL 29 --7:30 P.M.
Miss Norma Lantz
PHILCO HOME ECONOMIST

Will Conduct The Demonstration

We want you to coma and benefit from this 
demonstration whetbar you own a Horn# 
Fraezar unit or not.

Miss Lants will demonstrate how to prepare 
foods for the freezer and will be able to 
answer any questions you may have in mind 
to ask.

REMEMBER. THE DEMONSTRATION IS 
FREE AND EVERYONE IS CORDIALLY 
INVITED TO ATTEND.

Rundell & Estlack
Phone 262

YOUR LOCAL PHILCO DEALER 
Allls-Chalmers Farm Machinery Clarendon. Texas

6RUUKI RuJJU

ENGLISH PEAS A C
Brim full. No. 2 Cans—2 f o r ..............

PINEAPPLE JUICE I A
46 os. C a n ............................................."I&C

MILK
Pat or Carnation—Large C a n ...........  I9C

ASPARAGUS Q A
All green spears—No. 2 C a n .............. V w C

SPINACH
Del Monte—No. 2 Can ...................... I v v .

WAXED PAPER A  A
Cut-Rite—Box ....................................L v C

MATCHES Q A
Diamond—Carton ...............................v V C

BABY FOOD A F
Heinz or Gerbers—3 C an s ................ A w C

Loin Steak Beef Roast Pork Chops
POUND

POUND
POUND

60c 49c 55c
WE REDEEM COLGATE-PALMOLIVE-PEET COUPONS

S O A P SUPER SUDS 
Large B o x__ .35

FRESH TOMATOES A A
Pick-O-Morn—Pkg. J .9 C

ASPARAGUS 4
Fresh—Bunch f7c

SPINACH 4 A  
Fresh—Pound I V C

FLOUR M  M
Aunt Jamima—25 lbs.

SPUDS A F  
Red. No. 1—10 lb. Mesh Bag U v C

1 . •

O LEO Q
AU brands—Pound . q]9c

CUCUMBERS - f t
P ound .................................................. I v C

1. • -

•  RAISINS 4
Del Monte—1 lb. Pkg. |

* _  __
k

McCRARY GROCERY
wtotuvt* GROCERY & MARKET

H B B l l f l l l l l l l l
PHONE a


