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Mill Iron Ranch 
Sells Group Of 
Fine Bulls

L a f a y e t t e  M  H u s h e s ,  o f
Hughes Estate, owners at the Mill
Iron Ranch neaT Wellington, pre­
sented something new in the 
Hereford cattle industry at the 
Cottonwood headquarters of the 
ranch Monday when hundreds of 
ranchmen and breeders gathered 
for the second annual sale in in­
sistent competition for the fine 
animals.

Selling approximately 200 cal­
ves which represented the highest 
quality in Hereford breeding, the 
ranch abandoned the traditional 
cry of the auctioneer and gave the 
buyers their opportunity to pur­
chase by lot. Each of the prospec­
tive buyers drew for a place in the 
sale in advance, and he was per­
mitted to make his choice of the 
fine bulls in the order ofQbe num­
ber he had drawn.

Buyers from Clarendon includ­
ed Dr. C. G. Stricklin, Jack Moles- 
worth, A. T. Jefferies, W. J. Lewis 
Sr., J. D. McClellan, and W. J. 
Lewis Jr.

MM 3 /c  JOE C. BUTLER 
BACK IN STATES

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Butler re­
ceived a phone call Tuesday night 
from their son Joe C. Butler. He 
stated that he had landed back in 
the State s and at that time wa.' at

H t t
cific for the past 20 months. He 
stated in his call that he was on 
the sick list and did not know 
when he would get to come on 
home.

LT. BILLY PATMAN FINISHES 
MISSIONS AND PLANS TO BE 
HOME BY CHRISTMAS

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Patman re­
ceived a cable Tuesday from their 
son, Lt. Billy Patman, who is sta­
tioned in England. The cable stat­
ed that his missions have been 
completed, home coming date in­
definite, have Christmas tree 
ready.

Billy is with the 8th Air Corps 
in England and recently received 
a promotion to the rank of 1st 
Lieutenant.

Charles C. Gilbert 
Dies Early Sunday 
Morning

Charles C. Gilbert, father of 
Clyde Gilbert, died early Sunday 
morning at his home here follow­
ing an acute heart attack.

Mr. Gilbert, 80 years old, was a 
resident of Armstrong County for 
48 years before retiring from 
farming and ranching and mov­
ing to Clarendon some seven years 
ago. He was well known by those 
connected with the ranching busi­
ness throughout the Panhandle.

Funeral services were held 
Monday afternoon at 2 o’clock at 
the Griggfc Chapel in Amarillo, 
with C. A. Norred, minister of the 
Central Church of Christ, offici 
ating. Burial was in the Claude 
cemetery.

Besides his wife, Mrs. Alice 
Gilbert, he is survived by four 
sons, H. C. Gilbert of Clarendon, 
Richard Gilbert of Goodnight, 
Charles Gilbert of Springer, N. M., 
and Jack Gilbert of White Deer; 
two daughters, Mrs. Hattie Cobb 
of Amarillo and Mrs. Dal Harrold, 
Groom; two sisters, Mrs. Lee 
Bivins of Amarillo and Mrs. J. R. 
Tolbert of Oklahoma City; one 
brother, W. W. Gilbert of Vernon; 
15 grandchildren and 10 great­
grandchildren.

Active pallbearers were Frank 
Bagwell, Horace Baker, Perry 
Wolf, Tom Chapman. Herman 
Pafford, Art Barnett Honorary: 
Luck Pafford, Miles Oliver, Jim 
Christian, Jim Woodburn, Walter 
McClaren, Bob Taylor, Bob Camp­
bell. R. C. Weatherly and R. F. 
Smith.

Of all the beautiful floral of­
ferings that banked the casket of 
this beloved old timer, none car­
ried more sentiment than did the
TfSSP, *13oVe£
the old timers. Old Bones has 
made it a custom for many years 
to send a white rose when an old 
timer passes away.

“Uncle” Charley Gilbert, as he 
was lovingly called by many, saw 
many changes take place during 
his many years on the Plains. He 
watched a great cattle country 
gradually turned into farms, and a 
new generation spring up with 
new ideas and changing customs. 
He was not contented to live in 
a reclusive past, but rather he en­
joyed discussing new things as 
well as old. He enjoyed the radio 
and his newspaper - - faced his 
fellowman with honesty and a 
bold frankness that made him 
many friends. He will be missi 
by his many friends in Clarendi 
as else where in the Panhandle.

RATIONING 
AT A GLANCE

By PEPPY BLOCKER

Many of us have heard more 
about sugar lately than we have 
for a long time. Some stores have 
not even been able to fill orders. 
At the moment we are still in a 
period of critically tight supply. 
The normal high seasonal demand 
of the late summer was accentuat­
ed this year by an unexpectedly 
high issuance of sugar for home 
canning, partly because of the 
fruit crop. Issuances for this pur­
pose have been perhaps 30 percent 
higher than expected. On the sup* 
ply side, we had less beet sugar 
than normally. The output of cane 
refineries in some localities was 
limited by manpower. Shipping 
difficulties interfered with our 
supplies of imported refined 
sugar. All of these factors brought 
about a situation where, even un­
der rationing, demand at present 
exceeds supply. So please take 
these things into consideration 
when your next-door neighbor or 
the woman across the street says 
to you "Why don’t they let us 
have all the sugar we need—I’ll 
bet they have it stacked sky-high 
in the warehouses." The Office of 
Price Administration was created 
for your protection and the pro­
tection of our boys overseas, so 
let’s back it up, not cuss it out 
and tear it down.*

And don’t forget our current 
slogan—“Let’s all team up to keep 
prices down, for the sake of 
America’s future!”

S/SgL Tommy Mandril of the 
Roswell Army Air Field spent 
Sunday here with his wife and 
baby and their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. A. Warren.

Bronchos To Play Traditional Game 
At Memphis This Friday Night

A large number of football fans 
are expwftM'to journey to Mem­
phis. this Friday night to, 
the Broncs meet their trad 
foes, the Memphis Cyclones.

The game between the Broncs 
and the Cyclones has always been 
a good game due to the old rivalry 
that has existed between the 
teams from ’way back yonder.

The Broncs will enter the game 
as the underdogs, the Memphis 
club having shown quite a bit of 
ability all through the season and 
topped it off last week by defeat­
ing Lefors 14-0. This may mean a 
lot and again may not, for the 
Broncs are still mad from the 
“plus otherwise” handed them in 
the game with Shamrock last 
week.

The Bronc club received anoth­
er casualty this week when Beard 
received a badly sprained ankle in 
practice Wednesday afternoon. He 
probably won’t see any service in 
this game.

Outside of Beard, the remainder 
of the Broncs will be in there do­
ing their best to bring, back a vic­
tory for Clarendon.

The starting time for the game 
will be 8 p. m. instead of the prev-

see
could kardly keep them away 
There are others that should make 
their plans to go along and boost 
the Broncs. It does everyone lots 
of good to get out, and this is a 
special occasion in football.

iougly advertised 8:30.
There «lrill be a Tdfge^itmtberef- .Guinea war area.

CPL. WILUAM C. MEARS 
LEAVES WEDNESDAY 
FOR REASSIGNMENT

Cpl. William C. Mears left Wed­
nesday morning for Santa Bar­
bara, California for re-assignment. 
He has been visiting wife and 
friends here for the past several 
days. Cpl. Mears returned to the 
Stated in August after, having 
served several months in the New

OKLAHOMA CITY  r

PVT. WARREN HARDIN 
GRADUATED FROM 
RADIO SCHOOL

Pvt. Warren Hardin, 24, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hardin of 
Clarendon, has been graduated 
from the AAF Training Com­
mand's aircraft radio mechanics 
school at Truax Field where he 
studied the servicing of radio 
equipment used on U. S. bombers 
and fighter planes, it was an­
nounced today by the post com­
mander.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Mace and 
Mr. and Mrs. Buddy Jones were 
down from Farwell Saturday and 
Sunday, visiting their father, W. 
M. Mace and other relatives at 
Lelia Lake.

The following Donley county 
men passed their physical exam­
ination at Oklahoma City Novem 
ber 2nd.

Allen Russell Hardin, Conal 
Paulson Riley, Ted Tomlinson, 
Marva Lee Thomas Mays, James 
Haskell Swearingen and Marvin 
Charles Salmon.

FOURTEEN DONLEY MEN 
INDUCTED NOV. 1

Fourteen Donley County men 
reported at Oklahoma City, Nov 
1st. for induction into military 
service.

They are Slaton J. R. Christie, 
Orville Earvin Housden, James 
Leon Reid, Forest Ray Morton, 
Robert Lee Tolbert, James Frank 
lin Jackson, Jr„ Benjamin Burton 
Talley, Billy Douglas Perdue, 
Teddy Joe Myers, James Douglas 
Riley, Billy Gene Morgan, James 
Hodley Painter, James Richard 
Howell and William Fred Pierce.

Eleven Youths 
Receive Gilts In 
Club Program

Eleven Donley County youths 
have been selected to receive gilts 
in the Chamber of Commerce pro­
gram for the 1945 Spring Gilt 
Show, according to J. R. Gillham, 
local Vocational Agriculture in­
structor. These youths were chos­
en on a basis of their facilities to 
take care of the gilts and their at­
titudes as shown by their school 
work.

Dorsey Earl Laffel, E. Risen- 
hoover, and C. A. Ellis, received 
Chester white gilts; Drew Christie 
and Frank Jones received berk- 
shire. gilts; Harord McDonald, 
Keith Reetfa and Ronald Doherty 
received duroc gilts, Rex Bradford 
received a Poland China gilt, and 
Loy Leeper a spotted Poland 
China gilt. Joe Wayne Dilli will 
receive a spotted Poland China 
gilt in the near future.

These youths will feed and care 
for the gilts this winter and show 
them in the spring. The winner 
will receive a war bond and the 
others doing a creditable job will 
receive cash awards.

MRS. CLYDE GILBERT 
REPORTED IMPROVED

■seriously ill Sunday night, is re­
ported some bettdr at this time. 
Friends here have been very anx 
ious concerning her condition 
which has been almost critical at 
times. She has been receiving 
medical attention at the Clinical- 
Adair hospital here.

RAY BULLS WOUNDED 
IN FRANCE I

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Bulls receiv­
ed a telegram Monday from the 
War Department stating that their 
son Ray Bulls had been slightly 
wounded while in action in 
France. Ray is with an Infantry 
division over there.

Church Council 
Has Meeting

The Church Council of Women 
met at the Presbyterian Church 
on World Community Day, Nov. 
3rd at 3 o'clock with Mrs. Millard 
Word presiding.

The theme of the meeting was 
“Peace.” Mrs. Ament of the 
Christian Church gave the devo­
tional, bringing out the thought 
that enduring peace could come 
only through the reign of the 
Prince of Peace. The thought was 
reinforced by scripture rending by 
several /women and all Joined in 
singlng-Artterit'a.’ . r, • *

Report was made by Mrs. HI 
of the splendid response to the 
call for clothing for the wos-torU 
countries. She reported that 715 
garments were sent. Ail the dona­
tions which oould not be used 
were pastedjmi to the local Jted 
Cross for use as needed.

Reports were made of the var­
ious activities of the Council. Mrs. 
C. A Burton gave the article pre­
pared by the Federal Council of 
Churches of Christ in America, 
giving the foundations on which 
peace must be built, and a sum­
mary of the uniform cooperation 
being given by all the great re­
ligious bodies of our nation. A 
short round-table discussion fol­
lowed, led by Mrs. Word. There 
was very good attendance of the 
women of the various churches of 
the town, and by several of the 
ministers.

A social hour followed the pro­
gram during which the Episcopal 
ladies who were the hostesses of 
the afternoon, served delightful 
refreshments.

Donley County Voters Give Strong 
Support To Democratic Party
MRS. LONGAN HOSPITAL 
PATIENT HERE

Mrs. Edith Longan is reported 
critically ill in Adair Hospital 
where she became a patient late 
Wednesday. Mrs. Elizabeth Evil- 
sizer of Amarillo, and Mrs. Dollie 
Beach of Plainview arrived this 
morning to be with their sister. 
Mrs. Frank Loper of Amarillo, 
friend of the family, also arrived 
this morning.

GW AN H. WILKINSON 
SLIGHTLY WOUNDED

Word was received Friday that 
Pfc. Gwan H. Wilkinson was 
slightly wounded in action while 
serving ih Italy on October 18th.

On March 22, 1944 he was quali­
fied in arms to wear a badge and 
bar in Bar Course “A” from a 
score of 219, at Fort Jackson, 
South Carolina. He has served six 
months across and was made Pfc. 
in September. He is the husband 
of Mrs. Mary Alice Wilkinson of 
Lelia Lake and a son of Mr. and 
Mrs. O. L. Wilkinson of Claren

Irishmen Down 
Broncs 18-7

The Shamrock Irishmen invad­
ed the local gridiron lust Friday 
night and with luck and what 
have you, defeated the Broncs 
18-7.

The Broncs were slow in getting 
started, but picked up their stride- 
in the second quarter to give the 
Irish a real battle.

The Irish scored the first coun­
ter in the first quarter with Kil- 
man taking a pass and going over 
the goal line.

Their second score came in the 
second quarter. This score is one 
that the Clarendon squad had to 
take like bad medicine, for the 
officials calling the game allowed 
the Irish to use five downs instead 

jof thefir regular four downs, thus 
allowing the set-up for the score. 
They scored on another pass in the 
fourth quarter for their final score 
of 18. '

The Broncs received their only 
registered score in the fourth 
quarter when Cowan drove over 
from the 6 yard line.

The Broncs had another scoring 
play in formation when Cowan 
had an open field between .him 
and the goal lfhe and dropped the 
ball oivthe five yard line and a 
ShamrtSck p«p<T game in and 
touched the ball "l^st ■far-fore it 
went out of bounds. Many fans 
have asked just what caused 
Cowan to drop the ball. Well, 
here’s the explanation: Coach 
Naylor ha<J instructed the boys to 
switch the ball to their left side 
after they had gotten through the 
line so that it would free their 
right in order to stiff arm. Cowan 
happened to think of this, al­
though he was in the clear, and 
dropped the ball during the shift­
ing process. Nobody was more de­
pressed over this bad luck than 
Cowan. He made a fine run and 
was an outstanding player thru- 
out the game. Cowan is a new 
man in the backfir'd and has seen 
very little service in that capacity.

All the Broncs played a good 
game and by rights should have 
won this one by at least 7 points. 
This writer believes the Broncs 
are the stronger team.

The Shamrock game has always 
been a Jinx, but maybe some day 
our boys will overcome i t

Services Held For 
Mrs. A. E. Benson

Funeral services were held 
Monday afternoon at the First 
Baptist Church for Mrs. A. E. 
Benson with Rev. Hal Upchurch, 
officiating. Mrs. Benson passed 
away at her home here last Satur­
day following a quite lengthy ill­
ness.

Mrs. Benson came to Texas in 
1891 and to Hall county in 1892. 
She moved to Clarendon in 1913 
and had resided here since that 
time.

She is survived by three sons, 
Hardy M. Benson, George E. Ben­
son and Floyd C. Benson, all of 
Hereford; four daughters, Mrs. 
Vivian Major of Hereford, Mrs. 
J. H. Miller of Amarillo, Mrs. L. C. 
Parker Jr. of Wichita Falls and 
Mrs. L. Goldston of Houston; one 
sister, Mrs. W. H. Youngblood of 
Brice. Also eleven grand children 
and one great grand child.

Pallbearers were M. R. Allens- 
worth, Walter Clifford, Walter 
Taylor, S. C. Bell, Jim Swift and 
Forest Sawyer.

nt was in Citizens wmi Burum Wunerril
Home in charge of arrangements.

Donley county balloters, ap­
proximately 1,575 strong, gave 
overwhelming support to the 
Democratic ticket of Roosevelt 
and Truman in the election held 
here Tuesday.

Complete tabulations for Don­
ley county, with the exception of 
the Bray box which is still out, 
gave the Democrats 1158, Republi­
cans 285, Regulars 111, Socialists 
1, and Prohibitionists 4.

The figures above show the Re­
publican voters more than doub­
led the Texas Regulars and the 
Democrats more than doubled all 
the others combined.

Other tabulations showed Gov­
ernor Coke Stevenson to receive 
1373 votes to Peasley's 128. In the 
race for Congressman, Worley re­
ceived 1263 to Me D. Bybee’s 67.

Latest reports over the entire 
nation show Roosevelt to be car­
rying 413 electorial votes as com­
pared to Dewey’s 118. At this time 
the figures show that Dewey is 
carrying more electorial votes 
than Wilkie did in 1940 which was 
82 to Roosevelt’s 449.

It appears that the people of the 
United States have made their 
choice and now that the election is 
over, we must forget our small 
differences and go forward in a 
renewed effort to lick our enemies 
and bring our boys home as quick­
ly as possible.

...u forest baw

S H e j a s s r

Gilt Pig Sale 
Successful

Eighty-two gilt pigs were sold 
on November 4th by members of 
the Clarendon F.F.A. Chapter and 
Donley County 4-H club to club

MOISTURE MIXED WITH FROST 
IN THIS WEEK’S WEATHER

Crop gathering was slowed 
down the first of the week when 
.52 inch rain fell in a hard down­
pour Monday night to keep cotton 
pickers and feed gatherers out of 
the fields until Wednesday.

The low temperature registered 
by the Airport for the week was 
36 degrees Wednesday night. An 
easy detectable frost was seen this 
morning and cars standing out 
overnight had a good crust of ice 
on them.

Miss Noma Cousins of McLean 
is visiting her sister and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Lowry.

number of schools and communi­
ties over this section of Texas. Ap­
proximately one-hundred teach­
ers, county agents, and club 
youths attended the sale.

Sales were made to Hermleigh, 
Snyder, Wilson, Spearman, Estel- 
line. Childress, Turkey, Lakeview, 
Quitaque, Wellington, Quail, Sam- 
norwood, Panhandle and Farwell, 
with the biggest sale going to the 
Wilson F.F.A. Chapter. They 
bought nine durocs, five berk- 
shires, and two Chester white gilts. 
The sale returned approximately 
$1,600 to the youthful owners.

Mrs. Claude Thornton, after 
several days visit here with her 
brother, A. L. Mace and family 
and other relatives, returned to 
her home in Ft. Worth, Monday.
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* LIBRARY NOTES *
♦  By Mrs. C. A. Burton ♦

Reports from various hospital 
libraries under the Veterans’ Ad­
ministration attest to the value of 
reading to the patients—and this 
statement which enumerates quite 
a list of benefits closes with this 
statement: "It is felt that much 
has been cacomplished where a 
patient has been pointed success­
fully to his local public library as

a source for continued reading af­
ter discharge from the veterans 
hospital."

The Book Club has given us two 
more books—“The Return” by 
Margaret Rhodes Peattie—a beau­
tiful little war-time classic, and 
“Lady in Waiting” by Roy Galla­
gher—a laughable, human story.

W. L. White, author of "They 
Were Expendable,” is finishing 
another book about his trip to 
Russia. His last book was “Queens 
Die Proudly"—the story of a Fly 
ing Fortress.

Kathleen Winsor’s new book,

Jungle Surgery

Construction Helpers
NEEDED AT ONCE

—for—

L  0. Stocker Co.
BORGER, TEXAS

CONSTRUCTING 100-OCTANE AVIATON GASOLINE 
PLANT FOR PHILLIPS PETROLEUM COMPANY

Transportation furnished .nrout. to job. Top wags*—long time 
job Now working SO hour* a wook—Tim. and on.-half after 
40 hours.

m n w  Q U A R T * * *  A Y A 1U 9 U

Boo Company Raprasantatlvo at War Manpower Commission

U. S. EMPLOYMENT SERVICE 
O F F I C E

AT CHILDRESS OR BORGER, TEXAS

.  Arm y Signal Corps Photo
This picture was taken at a  field hospital Just behind our lines in Burma. 
The patient is one of opr brave Chinese allies, Bun 8 h s  Inn. Operating, 
le ft to right, are 14. CoL Phillip O. C. Bishop, East 73rd 8 t ,  New York, 
and MaJ. Kuland W. Hipsler, 1 «  West Mth St., New York. Administering 
American blood plasma to T /8  Elmer J. Lustlen, Cole Camp, Mo. Run 8ha 
Inn caught a  Jap shell fragment through b o  head, losing his eyesight, 
lie  also sustained wounds In the left 4hlgh and forearm. Note the make­
sh ift operating table of a  stretcher set up on four tree branches Our men 
and thoee of our Alllee who fight heslde them receive the heat medical 
care in the world which is made poeelblc by your purchase of War Bonds.

“Forever Amber,” has an advance 
printing of 275,000 copies, and de­
spite the Hays Office announce­
ment that the historical novel 
about Charles II would not be ac­
ceptable as film fore, she has been 
offered $100,000 for the movie 
rights.

The Pulitzer Prize Committee is 
considering an award for the best

W. T. LINK 
Lawyer

Income Tax Service

Dr. J. Gordon Stewart
PHYSICIAN A SURGEON

Office In Latson Bldg. 

Ground Floor 
Office Phono 239 

Residence Phono 253
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PREPARE NOW FOR 
WINTER WEATHER

YOUR HOME COMES FIRST
•  NEW  W A LLPA PER  and  PA IN T help  hold 

o u t th a  cold w aathor.

•  W aather S trip p in g  and  C aulk ing  saal th a  
cracks; kaap  o u t th a  cold and  holds your 
w a rm th  lnalda.

•  If  you have  a fau lty  roof, y o u r w arm  a ir  lnalda 
w ill aacapa. W a have a good supp ly  of com po­
sition  roofing an d  shingles.

•  N ew  Doors. W indow s an d  W indow  Glass.

•  P lu m b in g  supplies—pipe fittin g s and  flx tu rsa .

F ix  y o u r hom a up  now  and  in su re  aga inst th a  cold
w e a th e r an d  a t th e  sam e tim e, have  it b eau tifu l

an d  com fortab le  for th e  ho liday  seasons ahead.

original radio production of the 
year.

Lawrence Stallings, author of 
one of the greatest theatrical hits 
of World War I, "What Price 
Glory,” has written a novel of this 
war about the Marine to be called 
‘The Streets Are Guarded.”

Gertrude Atherton, the Califor­
nia novelist whose stories many 
of you will remember, was 87 
years old in October and has just 
finished a 100,000 word historyof 
Northern Califqmia, and is hard 
at work on another book. She may 
be writing a war story, judging 
from her recent statements that 
“Germans are a nation of fools” 
because they have always wanted 
their thinking done at the top— 
and of Japan she continues, “They 
are barbarians, they don't belong
"1 ....................................

Betty Smith, author of “A Tree 
Grows in Brooklyn” has complet­
ed 30,000 words on a new novel. 
She lives in Chapel Hill, North 
Carolina in a house she always 
wanted — and often wondered 
what a person would have to be 
to live in such a house. It is an 
old Southern mansion which she 
bought 15 minutes after it was put 
up for sale.

Deana Drew is the name of the 
young lady bom to Mr. and Mrs. 
U. J. Drew of Seymour, Texas 
November 3rd. She is the first 
granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
C. E. Griggs.

Anim al HealthProduct;,

l

SHAMBURGER LUMBER CO
OSCAR H. THOMAS, Mgr.

.

Phone 20

OPA TO HELP 
LOCATE CARS

Holders of certificates for the 
purchase of new cars can get help 
from the Office of Price Admin­
istration in locating that automo­
bile, that Agency announces. Any 
certificate holder having diffi­
culty in laying hands on a car is 
urged to write OPA, Inventory 
and Control Branch, Empire State 
Building, New York 1, N. Y. The

records of that office will be made 
available to assist the buyer in lo­
cating an automobile.

At thq same time OPA will re­
quire all automobile dealers to 
post lists of their current inven­
tory of 1942 cars held for sale and 
dealers who refuse to sell to a 
buyer who has the cash and re­
quired papers may be barred from 
dealing in any cars rationed now 
or in the future.

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to thank our many 

friends for their kindness and 
sympathy during the illness and 
death of our mother. May God’s 
blessings be yours is our prayer.

The A. E. Benson children 
and Relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Land are 
visiting their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Land at Tucumcari, N. M.

Easy to apply. Quick to act
Stop* “pink eye: ioeaee. A 3-graai 
bottle—enough to treat M to to 

11.00.

’/> JkMtgAff
*- Coif Proscription 

For the treatment of dietary 
diarrhea. A time teeted formula. 
Gate the Job done. Large bottle— 
4 *  ouncee—$1.00.

■mr ,  I
S u lfa  P o w d o r

A OUUa drug 
anliel wounds. Promote* prompt 
healing. Convenient shaker can— 
1% ounoae—41 .00.

____ are made by practical cat­
tle people, teeted In their own 
herd, and guarantee<1 to get the 
Jab dene to yours. Wa are proud 
to bo tha exclusive agency In 
our town for this lino of out­
standing original products. Drop 
In any time and let us show 
them to you and explain their

Douglas-Goldston 
Drug Co.

THE REXALL STORE 
* Phono 36

WE DON’T SERVICE THESE 
BUT WE DO SERVICE YOUR CAR

Ju s t  like you roally  w an t it. Q uality  gasollno, m o to r olla, an d  a W ash and  
L ubrica tion  Survicu th a t la tops.

PLEN TY  A NTI FREEZE------LARGE STOCK O F BA TTERIES

DAVIS Bumper to Bumper Service
DALE HILL.
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QUALITY AT SERVICE

farmers EzchanSe
GROCERY & MARKET

We Deliver Bring Us Your Cream & Eggs Phone 63-J

HOMINY 1 Q c

BEANS 5 C
Im m atu red  shelled  Soy—No. 2 C an .................

ROYAL PUDDING £ g c

ASPARAGUS
Bi-A-Can—S lse 303 C an—3 f o r .................

6 sm all Cans 
White Swan

SERV ICE
hristmas Carbs

Holiday greetings to personnel 
overseas should be mailed now.

Allow sufficient time for de­
livery even in the most distant 
theaters of opera tion  before 
Christmas day.

They must be sent in sealed 
envelopes and prepaid at the 
first-class rate of postage.

Be sure you have the correct 
address. Follow the example 
below:

P v t  John K. Doe, ASN 32185691 
Company F, 999th Infantry 
APO 000, c/o Postmaster 
New York, N. Y.

K alaurd b , U S. War Department, Bureau at Public Relations.

8 B ottles

Coca-Cola

Plus Deposit

Meal FANCY CREAM  
Fresh S h ipm ent 

5 Pounds . r ...........

Vifl Flour SUNNY BOY 
Satisfaction assured  
25 l b s . .........................

MARVENE
Soapless Suds
2 lb. Pkg.

45c
OATS

White Swan 
3 lbs.

19c

RAISINS
Fancy Thom pson Seedless— l 3/<t lbs.

Apricots in heavy syrup 2 9  C
W hole unpealed—No. 2 Vi C an .................

PINTO BEANS
Cholca R ecleaned—5 l b s . ....................... 50c

BUY YOUR CURED AND FR E SH  M EATS

WE SERVE QUALITY MEATS

l i i v i v i i v i r i l f f i i i i i a » ‘I i
I T J  H

EVERY DAY AT OUR

DRY GOODS DEPARTMENT
Mens Shop Capts . .  49c
______________________________ f ________________________ .

Single wool Blankets .. ‘* 6 95 up
Men Sweaters
All Wool and Part Wool

$£98 up

Men Shirt 
and Drawers

EACH

$£16

Boys Coveralls... . . . . .$£98 up
Boys Corduroy Overalls $£98 up
Ladies Crepe Dresses..... SA95

•__________ * '__________________________ ~

Childrens Robes............$498
All S ties

THE TEMPLE OP TRUTH

• By the Apeatle

Experience may not be worth 
what it costs, but that is what you 
have to pay for it.

♦ ♦  ♦
The radio industry will not real­

ly get smart until they produce a 
machine by which one may isolate 
the soprano germ.

♦ ♦  ♦
Worry is the grindstone on 

which a man holds his nose while 
he does his own turning.

♦  ♦  ♦
When you feel inclined to quit, 

remember it is not the size of the 
dog in the fight that wins, but the 
size of the fight.

♦  ♦  ♦
Good habits pay better divi­

dends than the bad ones, and are
I J u s t  a s  t i n *  t o  q u i t

♦  ♦  ♦
The honeymoon is over when he 

takes her off the pedestal and puts 
her on a budget.

♦  ♦  ♦
An expert is just an ordinary 

man a long way from home these 
days. .

♦  ♦  ♦
In ancient time they blamed 

man’s downfall on the apple. Now 
it is the "peach.”

♦  ♦  ♦
A girdle is the only thing ever 

heard about that binds ’em to­
gether, sustains ’em longer, and 
makes ’em look better than nature 
intended.

♦  ♦
Cupid is the guy who, when he 

hits the mark, generally Mrs. it.
♦ ♦  ♦

A secret is something known all 
about town, and yet the small 
town newspaper dare not publish 
it. Right here is where we had 
better drop the whole thing.

visiting their daughter, Mrs. Burk 
Debord. Mr. Lilly also visited his 
brother in Foard County and to­
gether these two men are plan­
ning a big deer hunt in the moun­
tains of New Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. Brandon of Spring 
Dale, Ark. have moved into our 
community.

Mrs. Branch and son of Mel- 
borne, Okla. were visitors in the 
Earl Cox home last week.

Mrs. Austin Rhoades was called 
to Memphis Saturday by the ill­
ness of her daughter, Mrs. Eileen 
Brown.

Mrs. Corbell and children had 
business in Amarillo on Thursday.

Helen Rhoades spent the week 
end in Amarillo visiting her sister 
11a Kay.

Mrs. henry Wilson is on the sick 
list this week.

Cpl. Don Hickey is here visiting 
Mrs. Hickey and other relatives.

Mrs. Meryl Thompson and
U u ,  H a r p  o f  A m a r i l l o

spent tne week end with tneir 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. B. Harp. 
Mrs. Harp accompanied them to 
their home in Amarillo on Mon.

; H u d g i n s  ;
♦ Mrs. S. M. Harp ♦

'there was liie usual crowd out 
for Sunday school Sunday.

Bro. Goodnight is to preach this 
Sunday at 11 o’clock a. m. and 
4 p. m.

Mr. Wes Roy of Fort Worth 
visited his sister, Mrs. John Per­
due and family.

Mr. and Mrs. John L. Fowlkes 
and children took Sunday dinner 
in the Harp home.

Mr. and Mrs. L. C. Tims and 
family took Sunday dinner in the 
John Perdue home.

Mr. and Mrs. Weaver of the 
North Plains spent the week end 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Mark Rainey.

Mr. and Mrs. John Fowlkes and

children and Mr. and Mrs. S. M. 
Harp and Sidney called on Mr, 
and Mrs. L. O. Christie and fam­
ily of Martin.

Mr. Rudolph Perdue spent the 
week enH visitine in Amarillo and 
Grandpa and Grandma Perdue 
returned home with him after a 
week visiting with their children.

N. M. McGlone called on S. M. 
Harp Monday night.

Donley County Leader. $2 •  year.

THE MAGIC FIRST DOSE
Start relief when your back aches, 
bladder burns, desire to get up 
often at nights. CIT-ROS balances 
the ph. of the body fluids, relief 
comes quickly, the body repairs 
the irritated tissues. Pain and 
soreness disappear. Get CIT-ROS 
$1.00 at your druggist. For sale by 

Douglas 8c Goldston Drug Co.

INSURANCE OP ALL KINDS—

ABSTRACTS OP TITLE

REAL ESTATE NOTARY PUBLIC

CLARENDON ABSTRACT CO.
C. C. POWELL

Phona 11 Claxandon

Y O U  W IL L  L IK E

The Christian Science Monitor
An International Daily Newspaper 

fo r these fo u r im portan t differences:
N O  SEN SA TIO N A LISM — N O  CRIM E— N O  A N IM O SIT Y  

T H O R O U G H  NEW S A NA LY SIS BY EXPERTS 
MORE EXCLUSIVE FOREIG N  fl£ D OM ESTIC COVERAGE 

CAREFUL CHECK O N  N EW S FOR ACCURACY __
The ChriacUn Sciatic* Publishing Socisty 

Ona, Norway Street, Boston 19, Massachusetts 4l
Price J  12.00 a Year, or $1.00 a M onth I"

Saturday Iuue, including Magazina Section, $2.60 a Y ear 
Introductory Offer, 6 Saturday Iaauea 23 Cent*

Name _______________________ ________________________ —

A d d rtu _____ _____________ ______________________________—
SAMPLE COPY O N  REQUEST

J-

QUICK RELIEF FROM
Symptoms *f Distress Arising trrnn
STOMACH ULCERS 
»** to EXCESS ACID
FraeBookTetlsof Home Treatment that 
Moat Hal* or R WIS Cast Yea Nothing
O ver tw o million b o ttle , o f th« W IL L A R D  
T R E A T M E N T  h are  barn aold fo r ra llef o f 
fym ptom s o f di«tr«u Arising from 
aad B oaSem l Mem* due to

due t o __
Aak for “

-------- —  ,  1... , e ta -
AeM. Sold on IS  day*' trial I 

"  which fu lly

Douglas 8c Goldston Drag Co.
Lelia Lake, Texas 

Lolls Lake Drag Store

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC
Wo have completely overhauled our lead mill, re-placed 
all worn parts, and Installed a large Electric Motor, and 
are now ready to do your feed chopping.

No job, too large, or too smell, too wet, or too dry, 
for us to grind. When others fail or say it cannot be 
ground, bring it to ua. We are ready to demonstrate. 
SEE US FOR YOUR FEED CHOPPING. MIXING. AND 
PROCESSING - - - IN SHORT ORDER.

Headquarters for CHIC-O-LINE FEEDS of aH kinds.
Your Business Appreciated.

Simpson’s Mill & Feed Store
P h o n e  149
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♦ AS HTOLA J
♦ Mrs. Dick Tomlinson ♦

George Cain and family of 
Phillips were here Saturday visit­
ing relatives.

Slaton Mahaffey and daughter 
Edna visited friends in Canyon 
the past week.

Gail Reed is in Ft. Worth visit­
ing with an aunt who is ill.

Mrs. J. M. Graham visited in 
Clarendon Sunday with Mrs. Led­
better of Quanah who was visiting 
in the Chester Martin home.

Sgt. Chester Myers of the U. S. 
Army is home on furlough.

Kathleen Brinson returned 
home Sunday from the Adair hos­
pital.

Meryl Holland and wife of Pan- 
tex spent the week end with his 
mother, Mrs. Howard Holland.

Mrs. Raymond Slater had a 
tonsilectomy at the Adair hospital 
on Monday of last week.

Goble Barker and family visit­
ed in the Dewey Goodman home 
in Clarendon Thursday.

Cpl. Redell Henson of the Army 
Air Corps is home on a 19-day 
furlough.

Francis Brown spent last week 
in New Mexico on business.

Frankie Hommel of Canyon is 
visiting in the Grady Henson 
home.

Mr. and Mrs. Lilly of Idaho are
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W lnter w ea th er la n ea r and  tim e to  com e by  an d  get th a t  w e a th a r s trip p in g  
or s to rm  sash to  keep  th*  cold w e a th e r ou t. D on’t fo rget our U N IT IZ E D  
W A L L PA PE R  and  PIT T SB U R G H  PA IN T . I t  w ill m ake your hom e m ore 
com fortab le  and en jo y ab le  to  look at.

Foxworth - Galbraith
Tom  R oberts, M gr, Q U A LITY  B U ILD IN G  M A TER IA L P h o n e  21

w
ie
>e
(n
ie
•n
vs
:a
ir
r
ts-
»g
*d

jr
P

<d
iS,
1-
in
l -
■S.

f t  \ 1

ef
n-

a-
ic

I

j{



PAGE FOUR .THE DONLEY COUNTY LEADER. .Thursday, Noftmbtr I, IN *

n4

>

J

SULLIVAN—CONN ALLY
Announcement has been made 

of the marriage of Miss Vashti 
Sullivqn to Fred C. Connally. The 
ceremony took place in Dallas last 
Saturday morning.

The bride is a daughter of Mrs. 
Nellie Sullivan of San Antonio 
and the groom is the son of Mr, 
and Mrs. T. F. Connally of this 
city. T

The couple will make their 
home here in Clarendon where 
the groom will be connected with 
his father in the grain business.

WIN ONE 8. 8. CLASS
Mrs. J. T. Patman entertained 

the members and guests of this 
class at her home Monday after­
noon when they met in a business 
and social meeting. After the 
business meeting lovely refresh­
ments were served to the follow­
ing guests: Mrs. Annie Maud 
James, Mrs. Fred Connally; class 
members, Mesdames C. D. Mc­
Dowell, Van Eaton, Lon Rundell, 
Geo. Palmer, Tom Connally, Bill 
Patman, H. W. Hanks, Will John­
son, A. A. Mayes, Weatherly and 
the hostess. The class presented 
Mrs. Palmer with a going-away 
gift

1130 NEEDLE CLUB
Mr*. Nora Decker was hostess to 

the Needle Club at her home 
Tuesday afternoon. The usual 
work of knitting and sewing was 
enjoyed for several hours. At the 
social hour, Mrs. Decker served 
lovely refreshments to Mesdames 
Maggie Hunt, Ona Tatum, Mary 
Wallace, Dollie Wilson, Emma 
Ayers, Mildred Larimer, Edna 
Russell, Moselle Wright and 
hostess Nora Decker. The club 
will meet at the home of Mrs. 
Russell, Nov. 21.

David Johnson of Amarillo 
spent the weekend at home here.

KAPPAS HAVE 
CHINESE PARTY

The members and pledges of 
the Kappa Kappa Sorority were 
entertained Wednesday afternoon 
with a Chinese party in the home 
of Marilyn Maher. The hostess 
wore the conventional Chinese 
costume; the guests removed their 
shoes upon entering and were 
seated on the floor.

Mary Ann Bromley related in­
teresting Chinese customs. “The 
Chiangs of China” by Clark was 
reviewed by Mary Nell Hanks.

Chow min, rice cakes, and tea 
were served by the hostess. The 
pledges gave an informal demon­
stration by eating rice with chop 
sticks.

Those attending were: Beverly 
Stricklin, Kathleen Grady, Ruth 
Patman, Betty Rhodes, Marilyn 
Bartlett, Klj^a Wilson, Melba 
Ruth Grady, Dorothy Tatum, 
Helen Porter, Mary Ann Bromley, 
Edna Lou Lamberson, Betty Jean 
Brown, Mary Nell Hanks, Alma 
Jo Mosely, Jean Porter and Mrs. 
Rufus White.

JUNIOR BEAUX ARTS CLUB
The Junior Beaux Arts Club 

met in the home of Yvonne de 
Vlaming Thursday, Nov. 2, 1944, 
with Lucille Wallace co-hostess.

All business, both new and old, 
was attended to. Johnnie John­
son’s withdrawal from the club 
was accepted and Faye Kidd was 
elected as reporter in her place. 
The programs for the following 
year were read by Miss Howren. 
La Voise Armstrong was elected 
librarian. The club decided to 
have a food sale just before 
Christmas and give proceeds 
to the American Red Cross.

After the business was taken 
care of the program was turned 
over to Peggy Wiedman, the 
chairman. The program was based 
on poems and songs of World

W I N T E R I Z E
N O W

The PHILLIPS 66 WAY
BRING YOUR CAR IN AND LET US GIVE IT THE 
PROTECTION AGAINST WINTER WEATHER, THAT 
IT DESERVES.

A Good, First Class Wash Job
THEN

Change Greases in Differential 
and Transmission

CHANGE MOTOR OIL—
- - to the proper Winter Weight

Fill Radiator with 
ZERONE ANTIFREEZE

Wars I and II. Peggy read the 
poem "We Shall Not Sleep” by 
Lt. Col. John McCray during 
World War I. Marilyn Maher gave 
a Uik on the change of poetry of 
World War II and she also read a 
selection of war poems by Jack 
Kerri). Katherine May led the 
group in the singing of seme of 
the songs of World War L. Names 
and authors of songs of World 
War II were read and the group 
was directed in the singing of the 
songs by Cora Lee Muse.

The president took charge again 
and the meeting was adjourned to 
meet at Faye Kidd's home in De­
cember.

Lovely refreshments were serv­
ed to Billie Howerton, LaVoise 
Armstrong, Cora Lee Muse, Eliza­
beth Mauldin, Peggy Wiedman, 
Katherine May, Faye Kidd, Pat 
Alverson, Marlyn Maher, Miss 
Howren, sponsor, and the hostess 
vm Yvonne de Vlaming and Lu 
cille Wallace.

1

1926 BOOK CLUB 
ELECTS OFFICERS

The 1926 Book Club met in the 
home of Mrs. Rolle Bromley Tues­
day afternoon with Miss Maurice 
Berry assisting as hostess

During the business session, the 
following new officers were elect­
ed:

President, Mrs. Rolle Bromley; 
Vice-President, Mrs. Bill Bromley; 
Recording Secretary, Mrs. Bill 
Thornberry; Corresponding Secre­
tary, Mrs. Nellie Hoggatt; Treas­
urer, Mrs. Lloyd Shelton; Parlia­
mentarian, Mrs. Chas. Lowry; 
Federation Counsellor, Mrs. Gor­
don Stewart.

Two short stories, given in an 
interesting manner by Mrs. Ray­
burn Smith and Mrs. J. R. Porter, 
furnished the program for the af­
ternoon. Mrs. Smith kept the club 
spell-bound as she told “A Likely 
Exchange” by Jessamyn West. 
The setting is in Indiana with a 
Quaker background, but the cli­
max is reached in an exciting 
horse race. Mrs. Porter gave an 
Indian story, “The Buck in the 
Brush" by Charles L. McNicholes. 
This author writes of Indians of 
today. Having been reared on 
eleven different reservations, he 
is able to write authentically.

A delicious refreshment plate 
was served to Mrs. Joe Goldston, 
guest, and the following members: 
Mrs. C. E. Bairfield, Mrs. E. S. 
Ballew, Mrs. Bill Bromley, Mrs. 
L. N. Cox, Mrs. C. M. Lowry, Mrs. 
C. B. Morris. Mrs. Frank

ter, Mrs. W. E. Ray, Mrs. L. T. 
Shelton, - Mrs. Rayburn Smith, 
Mrs. W. C. Thornberry, Mrs. B. G. 
Watson, Mrs. Frank White Jr.

BUSY WOMEN 
8. 8. CLASS

This S. S. Class met in an all 
day business and social meeting 
in the Fellowship room at the 
Methodist Church Friday. A quilt 
was quilted and a covered dish 
luncheon was enjoyed at the noon 
hour. Quite a number were in at­
tendance.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
L. Guy Amant, Pastor

The Fellowship Supper last 
Thursday night was considered by 
all a very splendid evening to­
gether and much good accom­
plished in a full understanding of 
our plans. Attendance was count­
ed good.

Our services next Sunday will 
be at the 11 o’clock hour and the 
evening hour at 7:30. We had a 
record breaking attendance at the 
Bible school hour. May it be 
maintained with gains as we con­
tinue.

The Wednesday night service 
will be at 7:30, Bible study and 
devotional hour.

Thanksgiving Union services 
will be in the First Christian 
Church. Bro. Upchurch of the 
Baptist Church wtll deliver the 
sermon. May we make it a splen­
did service by all joining in the 
Thanksgiving spirit together.

• ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ a
•  ♦

J RED
♦  VOLUNTEER SERVICE ♦
♦ . •

C R O S *  J

Mr. and Mrs. Glen White of 
Shamrock were here to see the 
football game Friday evening.

Mrs. C. A. Burton
American prisoners of war in 

Germany refer to themselves as 
Kriegies—ah abbreviation of the 
German word meaning war pri­
soner—a word of sixteen letters 
which they found too hard to pro­
nounce.

At one camp the American pris­
oners of war issue two newspap­
ers, “The Kriegie Times” in the 
Center Compound at Stalag Luft 
III, and “The Circuit” from the 
South Compound of the same 
camp. Copies of both have been 
sent me through Home Service 
and I shall be glad to show them 
to you. Distribution in the prison 
camp is made by posting them on 
a bulletin board oh the cookhouse 
wall. They are typewritten with 
the headlines lettered in.

From the editorial of “The 
Circuit” I quote: “Through these 
composite pages, we endeavor to 
bring you greetings from a com- 
rhunity of Americans, and to show 
you the temper of our existence. 
It is not our wish to decry our 
position any further than to offer 
a smile for worried next of kin. 
Suffice it to say that speakers, 
musicians, writers; Artists, actors, 
men who were none of these, but 
are learning to be—all are using 
these days to build a world of 
mind that embraces tolerance and 
ability to work together.”

The paper contains notices of 
the various activities of the camp.

Both Protestant and Catholic ser­
vices are held each Sunday. The 
Protestant chaplain a  a Scotsman, 
captured while serving with the 
ftrNUh nnmtrnnpfttin Africa. Be­
sides the Sunday services he has a 
discussion group and Bible study 
class and teaches a session in psy­
chology and philosophy. The 
Catholic Priest conducts a weekly 
ethics class besides the Sunday 
services.

Music ranks high in entertain­
ment value for all POW’s. There 
are bands and choruses, sing­
songs and various types of musical 
instruments.

The cookhouse wall is by cus­
tom the bulletin board. Kriegies 
rely for their news on the Ger­
man newspapers and a Reich loud 
speaker recently installed on the 
cookhouse wall. Since only a small 
number of the POW’s can road 
German, important items are 
translated into English.

From the regular Prisoner of 
War Bulletin comes the news re­
cent measures taken for the relief 
of American prisoners held by 
Japan include a weekly shipment 
of 80,000 multi-vitamin tablets 
and a plan to permit each Ameri­
can held by Japan to cable his 
family once at the expense of the 
U. S. government. The vitamin 
tablets are mailed in small four- 
pound packages. There is, as yet, 
no positive proof, that they are 
reaching their intended destina­
tion but their value would be so 
great that the risk is iXrorth tak­
ing. There are approximately 
45,000 American prisoners in Eur­
ope and some 1,000,000 Allied 
prisoners.

Mrs. T. Bugbee of San Berdino, 
Calif, is visiting her son, Tom 
Bugbee at Claude and relatives in 
Clarendon.

Rufus White has been transfer­
red from Ft. Benjamin Harris to  
Ft. Sam Houston and says quite a 
few of the Clarendon boys are  
there, much to his enjoyment.

Frank White Sr. returned home 
Sunday from a visit with his son 
and wife, Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
White at Galveston.

Rev. and Mrs. Hanks left Wed­
nesday for Sweetwater where 
they are attending the Northwest 
Texas Conference.

Rev. and Mrs. G. T. Palmer are- 
attending the Northwest Texas 
Conference at Sweetwater this 
week.

Mrs. Sam Lowe and son Billy 
left Thursday morning for Dallas 
taking her mother, Mrs. Akins 
home and for a weekend visit.

Mrs. W. T. Lowe has gone t® 
Wichita Falls for a two weeks 
visit with her daughter and fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Roy Broadway.

Miss Marjorie Harlan, who pur­
chased the J. T. Hoy property on 
East 4th Street is completing ar­
rangements this week for the 
opening of her Floral Shop.

Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Turner mov­
ed this week from their place on 
East 4th Street to Lee’s Apart­
ments.

CHECK BATTERY FOR ANY WEAKNESS THAT 
MIGHT CAUSE YOU DELAY WHEN 

COLDER WEATHER ARRIVES.

POR DEPENDABLE SERVICE, COME TO

OLIN BAIN
Phillips 66 Station

Phillips Products -  Wholesale
P hono 19-J

QUILTING CLUB
The Quilting Club met with 

Mrs. Charles Longan as hostess. 
They met and organized. Officers 
elected were president, Mrs. J. T. 
Sykes; vice-president, Mrs. Don­
ald Harlan; Sec., & Treas., Mrs. 
Earnest Lamberson; Reporter, 
Mrs. A. B. Stephens. Mrs. Junior 
Spier and Mrs. A1 Word were 
elected to be the membership 
committee.

A covered luncheon was served 
at the noon hour to those present 
Mrs. J. T. Sykes, Mrs. Charles 
Blackburn, Mrs. Arthur Davis, 
Mrs. Earnest Lamberson, Mrs. A1 
Word, Mrs. Junior Spier, Mrs. 
Donald Harlan, and Mrs. Fred 
Easterling, Mrs. A. B. Stephens 
and the hostess, Mrs. Charles 
Longan.

One quilt was quilted and the 
next meeting will be With Mrs. A1 
Word on Nov. 14th.

—Club Reporter

A8HTOLA NEEDLE CLUB
The Ashtola Needle Club met 

Thursday, Nov. 2nd at the Club- 
room for an all day quilting. Two 
quilts were quilted.

Several came, early and brought 
covered dishes and the ladies en­
joyed quite a feat at the lunch 
hour.

Ten members and one visitor 
were present for the quilting. Ima 
Wallace was the visitor. Members 
present were as follows: Elizabeth 
Graham, Sue Rhoades, Johnny 
Poevey, Etta Watkins, Donne 
Henders, Anna Tomlinson, Vena 
Hudson, Julia SprungtT and the 
hostesses Laura Mahaffey and 
Lillie Knox.

BIRTHDAY PARTY
Mrs. E. D. Koen entertained 

with a birthday party honoring 
her grandson Truett Koen on his 
9th birthday at her home Monday 
afternoon. Each little guest brot 
a nice gift.

Games were played until Mrs. 
Koen served the lovely birthday 
cake and punch to Lewis Johnson, 
Hubert Kidd, Lois Ann Darby, 
Jerry Swinney, Jo Carrol and 
Glen Mace, Olen Jean Heckman, 
Bill Dale Hill. Chas. Anderson 
and Truett Koen.

7tlC44/UO AHEAD f a  SAViNGS
Hop, sk ip  and  ju m p  shopping from  m ark e t to  m ark e t w astee tim e, coats m oney, tires  you out. E n joy  th e  con- 
▼enience, th e  com fort, th e  econom y of b uy ing  ALL y o u r food needs in one p lace  • • - a t one tim e —  b y  shopping 
■t CLARENDON FOOD STORE—th e  com plete food m ark e t — w h ere  ONE ST O P shopping  m eans GO 
A H EA D  to  b igger savings. W e've ev e ry th in g  you w a n t for your tab le—q u a lity  foods in  th e  w id est v a r ie ty  
av a ilab le  - - - an d  o u r ab u n d an t supp lies m aan easie r and  qu icker shopping for you. ST O P IN  TODAY I

PECANS 4 9 C
L arg e  P ap e r Sheila—Pound

MINCE MEA1
2 lb . J a r 55c I

CRACKERS 1
B rlm full—2 lb. Box ™ 1,9c TOMATO JUICE 1

K uners—No. 2 C a n .........................  .
l 2 c l

PEANUT BUTTER d g r
Q u art ■  U P l #

PORK & BEANS
W hite S w an—Can 9c I

CABBAGE
POUND

3 * c
ONIONS

Yellow  
4 lbs. fo r

FANCY CREAM  

25 lb. S a c k ........Compound BIRD BRAND 

I l b s . ...........

4 lbs. fo r

19c  H o u r SILV ER PE A K S 

25 lb. Sack .........

R om an B eauties

APPLES
PEC K

75c
PEACH JAM  ,
Quart ............... 55c PEAS

Big M—No. 2 C a n ................. 15c
GRAPE JAM ' CORN 1 C .
Quart T W l. Brlmfull—NoTTUan I v C

CATSUP
D elm onta—Bottle ................ 25c TREAT

Armours—Can 39c
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F O R  S A L E

DOLLS! DOLLS!—Make you se­
lections now while stocks are 
complete.

Stocking's Drug Store
(38-p)

FOR SALE—5 room frame house, 
good condition, also barn for 
cow and chickens, located near 
junction of East first street and 
Brice highway. Anyone inter­
ested see Sam Tankersley.

(38-p)

AUTO GLASS—Prepare for win­
ter now. Auto Safety glass for 
any make car. No delay. Cut 
and polished -while you wait.

“You Always Save at”
THE PAINT STORE 

Hudson 8c Taylor’s Phone 82-M
(38tfc)

FARM FOR SALE—Located 3Vh 
miles north of Memphis, Texas, 
100 yds. cast of Federal high­
way. City water and gas; elec­
tricity if desired. Small cash 
payment, balance XU equal 
yearly payments. Interest rate 
5%, 2 times yearly. See or write 
Walter B. Baker, owner, Box 
481, Memphis, Texas. (38p)

CHRISTMAS GIFTS — Crochet 
bed spreads, table spreads, pil­
low slips, aprons, etc. to fill out 
your gift list. I invite new cus­
tomers as well as my old cus­
tomers. Mrs. A  H. Baker. (37tfc)

DIAMONDS—If you are engaged 
or getting married let us show 
you our fine stock of Diamond 
rings and wedding rings. For 
sale at a price you can afford to 
pay.

Stocking's Drug Storo
(38-p)

FOR SALE— 5 burner oil stove, 
Baltic Cream Separator, Win- 
Charger. Will sell or trade for 
Gas Heater. See Sam Tankers­
ley. (39-p)

INDIAN JEWELRY — Another 
shipment of Indian Jewelry di­
rect from the Reservation. 

Stocking s Drug Store
'  (37-p)

FOR SALE—Green Tomatoes, $1 
per busheL Phone 934-F2 after 
7 o’clock. (38-p)

FOR SALE—6-room house, bath 
and two porches. Call 272-W. 
Mrs. Dave Johnson. (36-2c)

FOR SALE—5-room stucco house 
with bath, modem convenien 
ces. 1 block south and 1 block 
west of Piggly Wiggly. Call 
259-W. (38-c)

GIFTS & TOYS—Take advantage 
of our Lay-away Plan and Buy 
now for Xmas.

“You Always Save at”
THE PAINT STORE 

Hudson & Taylor's Phone 82-M
(38tfc)

FOWL POX—Protect your flock 
from Fowl-Pox with Globe 
Fowl-Pox Vaccine. For sale at 

Stocking's Drug Store
(37-p)

GLOBE VETERINARY V A C ­
CINES—Always fresh and de­
pendable: give complete and 
lasting protection to livestock. 
For sale at ,

Stocking's Drug Store
(36-p)

FOR SALE—Three or four mod­
em residences, well located, 
$1500 to $4000. See Roy Clayton. 
Clarendon, Tex. (37-p)

FOR SALE — Windmill. Frank 
Lyle. (27tfc)

FOR SALE—D-T Carbolated Cre- 
sote Base. Kills and Repeli 
Mites, Fowl Ticks (Blue Bugs) 
and Repels Termites. Wood Pre­
server and Disinfectant.
Thomas Mill and Feed Store 

(29-tie)

t n o m i m n

■  MMMCtf 
W A LL FIN ISH

PAINT - WALLPAPER — The 
largest stock of fine quality ma­
terials in this entire area.

“You Always Save at"
THE PAINT STORE 

Hudson & Taylor’s Phone 82-M
(38tfc)

CHRISTMAS GIFTS—Shop early. 
Larger displays; wider assort­
ments and superior service at 

Stocking's Drug Store

I D E A L  CABINETS — Kitchen 
cabinets, Bath room cabinets, 
Utility cabinets, phone cabinets, 
medicine cabinets, comer cabi­
nets, all in stock, put up ready 
to install.

“You Always Save at”
THE PAINT STORE

Hudson & Taylor’s Phone 82-M
(38tfc)

DR. SALISBURY’S ROTA CAPS 
— The best for eliminating 
worms in laying hens. On sale at 

Stocking's Drug Store
(31-p)

MITES & BLUE BUGS — Easily 
exterminated with AVENAR- 
IUS CARBOLINEUM. Guaran­
teed remedy.

Stocking's Drug Store
(19-p)

Thompson Bros. Co.
Clarendon. Texas

W A N T E D
WANTED—To renovate old Mat­

tresses and have new ones for 
sale. Phone 340. Scotty Reneau.

(41-p)

WANTED—200 to 840 acres grass 
or Johnson grass pasture. Lee 
Muse. (31-c)

MISCELLANEOUS
PIANO LESSONS
Mrs. Page Harmon

5 blocks South of Junior College 
at old Condron place, Phone 480-R

(46-p)

Trotter Takes Up
Extension
Directorship

WANTED—Housekeeper for fam­
ily of five, room, board ar.d 
salary. Elderly lady preferred. 
Light work. Phone 410-R or sec 
Mrs. H. G. Bobbitt. (38-2c)

WANTED — Woman to do light 
house work. Phone 946-F2. Mrs. 
E. W. Bromley. (38tfc)

AMARILLO DAILY NEWS SUB­
SCRIBERS—Let us renew your 

subscription to the Amarillo 
Daily News.

Stocking's Drug Stors 
(Amarillo News Agents)

(34-p)
Highest Cash Prices paid foi 

Radios, Washers, Stoves, Fur­
niture. Household Supply Co.

(30tfc)
FEED CUTTING AND COMBIN 

ING—2 Row Power Binder-AC 
Combine. Phone 920-F4 or set 
Glenn Allen at Dick Allen farm.

(36-c)

1

1

To The PUBLIC
NOW OPEN For BUSINESS

With Complete Line of Feeds For

Livestock & Poultry

Up the Burma Road Go the Yanks

Donley County Agent, Charles 
Reed, received official notice that 
Dr. Ide P. Trotter was chosen di­
rector of Board of Directors, and 
assumed the duties of the office on 
November 1st. He is the sixth 
regular incumbent. He had served 
as professor and head of the 
Agronomy Department of A&M 
College since 1936.

He succeeds to the position 
made vacant in August, 1943, with 
the termination of the director­
ship of H. H. Williamson, now 
agricultural consultant to the Of­
fice of Price Administration, 
Washington. James D. Prewit, se­
lected last December by the Col­
lege Board as vice director and 
state agent, became acting direc­
tor at that time in place of George 
E. Adams, who had served in the 
same capacity after Mr. William­
son's services were terminated. 
Mr. Prewit remains as vice direc­
tor and state agent.

Dr. Trotter announced that E, C. 
Martin, acting vice director and 
state agent since December would 
become assistant state agent “and 
assist me in correlating the work 
of our large and efficient staff of 
subject matter specialists.” He ad­
ded that Miss Maurine Hearn, 
vice director and state home dem­
onstration agent, "will continue to 
assist me in the direction of the 
women's work throughout the 
state.”

“The large opportunities and 
responsibilities which lie ahead 
are fully appreciated,’’ Dr. Trotter 
said. He expressed "deep apprec­
iation" for the privileges of “re­
joining the forces which are car­
rying sound agricultural educa­
tion to farm people.” It is the 
plan, he said, “to continue to 
serve the agricultural interests of 
Texas with the complete existing

. ^gamxaUup ju jd^ans o( work.” 
"  '  ‘a  fW 'r’T f n t t f - r  w n s  h o r n  tn  T> n-

nessee anti received the B. A. de­
gree from the Mississippi College, 
Clinton; a B.S. in agriculture from 
Mississippi A&M College, and the 
doctor of philosophy degree from 
the University of Wisconsin grad­
uate school. He had 13 years ex­
perience as cotton and field crops 
specialist with the Missouri Ex­
tension Service before joining the 
Texas A&M College faculty.

Arm y Signsi Corps Photo
Here are some of our boys moving up the newly opened Burma road on their way to show the Nips what 
M’s like to be np against the American Army. The Germans hare already found out and now It’s the Japs’ 
turn to learn the hard way. Lend your dollars to Undo Sam by buying more War Bonds so that the war in 
the Far East may be over that much sooner. from u S. Trnmur

Lon Rundell went to Wichita 
Falls Tuesday night on business.

Redell Henson is spending his 
furlough visiting homefolkn

Mr. and Mrs. J. P. Davis of 
Howe, Texas visited in the home 
of Mrs. C. C. Gilbert the first part 
of the week.

Mr. and Mrs. Lowry of Canyon 
spent the weekend visiting their 
son and family, Mr. and Mrs. D.
Lowry.

Mr. and Mrs. Noel Harvey and 
son Gene of Petersburg, Texas, 
spent the week end here visiting 
with friends and relatives, before 
leaving for Hot Springs, N. M. 
where they plan to spend the 
winter.

v WE BUY AND SELL GRAIN
P  \ j O  «  *

LET US GRIND YOUR FEED
Our Hammer Mill is now in operation. 

Will appreciate a part of your business.

Clarendon Grain 
Company

Phone 93

Frankie Hommel is visiting 
homefolkf this week. She is at­
tending school at W.T.S.C.

THESE PRICES GOOD FOR FRIDAY, SATURDAY & MONDAY

Soap Flakes MARMALADE
Scully’s Citrus—2 lb. Jar . . . 19c

NOLA

PKG.

Famed Rocket 
Gun Puzzles 
Germans

The first question asked by 
German prisoners whp were cap­
tured in* Southern France was: 
“What is that weapon you use 
that spurts flame from its rear?”

“Evidently the German forces 
fighting in the South were green 
troops, for they spoke in reference 
to the Bazooka, the famed Ameri­
can rocket gun which has made 
history from Africa to India, 
said Captain R. M. Smith, com­
manding the Pantex Ordnance 
Plant, Amarillo, of which Cer­
tain-teed Products Corporation is 
prime contractor.

Designed originally as an anti­
tank gun, the Bazooka has been 
used by front-line soldiers effec­
tively against machine gun nests, 
pillboxes, and even fortified hous­
es. It is handled by a two-man 
team, loader and gunner. It 
weighs little more than an ordi­
nary rifle and can be used every- 
where. The Germans fear it more 
than they fear our artillery, and 
some have referred to it as mobile 
cannon.

The newest version of the Ba­
zooka, the M-9 Folding Bazooka, 
is normally carried as a two-piece 
unit and can be easily and quick­
ly assembled for firing. It has a 
new stock and is somewhat long­
er than the M1A1. The two-piece 
model is easier to carry through 
jungle terrain or .for dropping 
With paratroops.

In commenting on the Bazooka, 
Capb Smith said, “It is a weapon 
when carried in the hands of a 
soldier, that can destroy any ene­
my tank on the battlefield today."

ONIONS
Spanish Sweets

7 lbs.

25c
CALUMET

1 lb. Cai

19c
HONEY

Vo. gallon Jar

$115

SYRUP
Blackburns—Gallon B ucket...................... 75c
Tendertweet—No. 2 —  ttc
COTTON SACKS
Horn* made—12 ft. ................... $2.60
CHOCOLATE
Bakers, premium— Vi lb. Bar 19c
CORN FLAKES
Marco—11 os. Pkg. 5c
PICKLES
Sour mixed—Quart Jar , 35c
COCOA
Hersheys Va lb. Pkfs.—2 fo r .................... 25c
OATS
Brimful!, cup and saucer—Large Pkg. 29c
PEAS
Leader Brand. No. 2 Cans—3 for . . . 29c
MUSTARD
Edwards—9 os. Jar . . . 5c
PRESERVES
Cherry and Apricot—2 lb. J a r ............... 55c
SUGAR
Cora (ao points)—3 lb. B ag .................... 23c
GRAHAM CRACKERS
Brimfull—2 lb. Box ................. 35c
BLEACH
Laundrex—>/j gallon J a r ..................... 29c
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BINDER TWINE — COTTON SACK — 
RUBBER GLOVES —  COTTON

COTTON DUCK 
GLOVES

—IN OUR MARKET—
Moat is moro important now that coolor woathor has arrived. 
It helps build warmth and energy which is important to your 
family's health. Prepare your every day pa#nues from our largs 
selection of extra fancy grain fed Baby Beef. You will notice 
the difference in both quality and taste. Also plenty of pure 
pork sausage.

HOT BARBECUE DAILY

Mince Meat
2 1 .  Jar

CLIFFO RD & RAY
GROCERIES & MEATS

COLO STORAGE LOCKER SERVICE IN CONNECTION

Phone 5 We Deliver Phone 6
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Didn’t we see Bert Barns with 
Delene Blair Hallowe'en? Could 
the old flame have come back to 
Bert?

Say, regarding a foursome go­
ing to Wheeler last Friday, pidn’t 
they bring back some lovely sou­
venirs? Graham surely must have 
driven slowly. You should have 
seen him when he left town.

Why has T.U.D. suddenly turn­
ed “Republican" in civics class? 
Could she need a good grade? 
Well, teacher told her just where 
she stood.

Can't Barbara Bell stay out of 
the football fence?

Sue Smith seemed to be doing 
pretty well Hallowe’en night. Did 
you have a good time, Sue?

Why can’t Allie Mae Goodman 
give up hope and stop chasing a 
certain football hero?

J. R. Morgan surely was blitz­
ing around last Tuesday night

Weren’t there some certain peo­
ple around the McClellan house 
Hallowe'en night? Harry was that 
you on the search? Did Bell get 
lost? Tell us the score.

Louise seemed to be having 
trouble Saturday night. She was 
seen talking to five different boys 
and had a date with two others.

What were La Verne Darden 
and Billy Ray Graham doing rid­
ing around on the Memphis and 
Brice highway Hallowe'en night 
with Bell driving? After the Mid­
night show?

Why are two certain girls we 
know here looking forward to the 
Memphis game? Could it be be­

cause one of them has rated her 
car. Yes, that’s exactly i t

Why was Faye Kidd so mad at 
her little sister Tuesday night? 
Could it be that Faye was stood 
up and he went with Rubye? 1 
think they got together after the 
midnight show though and every­
thing is alright again.

There are some certain girls 
around the Campus who are ter­
ribly blue. Seems some boys left 
last Tuesday to go to Oklahoma. 
Have you had a letter, girls?

What certain trombone player 
and what certain clarinet player 
serenaded what certain teacher 
Wednesday night?

Tommy Saye was very disap 
pointed when he found that he 
could have gone to Wheeler. Too 
bad, Tom, maybe next time.

Betty was certainly in a daze 
last Wednesday morning. Was it 
Hallowe’en or Lee?

What were the kids in Treva 
Nell’s car doing Hallowe'en night?

Billye and Boo had a very 
guilty look on their face at the 
Hallowe’en midnight show. We 
wonder why?

Elise and Bobby Parker were 
seen’together Sunday night. Did 
you have a good time?

By the way, Calvin was “step­
ping out’’ Sunday night also. The 
girl’s name? You find out

A boy from Goodnight was a 
little mixed up last Wednesday 
night. Two girls are too many for 
one night anyway.

Why was Melba Ruth’s hair oily 
on one side Wednesday? Jack 
sure wears a lot of hair oil, etc.

Everybody is happy. “Dot”

ABSTRACTS •  LOANS 
and REAL ESTATE

Donley County Abstract Company
C. E. K ILLO U G H

Phone 44

heard from Jack, “Mcb” from Jer­
ry, and “Elise” from Bill.

Why did two certain Junior 
girls want “Bobby Parker’s Fire- 
Heels” to play Goodnight last 
Monday night?

We hear "Little Spot” has a 
new class ring. Quite a collection, 
eh?

What do you think of all of the 
people that have been converted 
into Republicans?

Flash !1 Saye catches all.

SOUTH WARD NEWS
The Blue Bird class in Miss Mc­

Gowan’s room has a new book. 
The name of it is “We Come and 
Go."

Jackie Estlack has been absent 
because of illness.

Mrs. Harter, Mrs. Knorpp, and 
Mrs. White gave a Hallowe’en 
party for Mrs. Meats’ pupils.

Mrs. Headrick’s room mothers 
gave her Second. grade a Hal­
lowe’en party.

Sylvia Luttrell entertained Miss 
Mongole's girls at her home Hal­
lowe’en night.

The Sixth grade had a Hal­
lowe’en party Tuesday. They 
made their own masks.

Mrs. Toland has been ill, and 
has not been able to teach this 
week. Mrs. Naylor has been tak- 
in gher place.

Patricia Porter will be the Fifth 
grade candidate for Queen.

The Third grade has had some 
interesting lessons on sea shells as 
one of the boys recently visited 
the beach.

PARADE
Friday, November 3, the band 

and pep squad assembled in front 
of the band building and started 
their march to town for a pep 
rally. After they got to town, the 
yell leaders led several lively yells 
to show that they were behind 
the team. The band played some 
numbers with the football spirit. 
They then marched back to 
school.

McCrary Grocery

NEW BOOKS FOR 
BOOK WEEK

AND MARKET
PH O N E 81-M W E D ELIVER

GRAPEFRUIT
N ice Slse—6 f o r .................................... 25c
APPLES
R om an B eau ty—Peck 75c
CRANBERRIES
Q u art 55c
FLOUR
P ur-a -S now  (2 glaasea free)—25 lbs.

$119

CARROTS
Bunch 5c

Pure LARD

LETTUCE
Nica slaa Hand

FRESH TOMATOES
Pound ...........................

10c

PINTO BEANS
100 lbs.................

PORK A BEANS
1 lb. C a n ______

CORN
Fancy—No. 3 Can

PEAS
Fancy—No. 3 Can

RIBBON CANE
East Taxaa— Vt gallon

15c
$8.49

10c
15c
15c
59c

Visit our Market for lunch 
meats of all kinds from 
which to prepare y o u r  
school lunches. • • > Also for 
our Home Killed. High 
Quality Beef. All choice 
cuts and veal steaks, roasts, 
etc. point free.

HOT BARBECUE

ONIONS 
7 lbs.

Book week, November 12-18, 
will find some very interesting 
new books on display in the Clar­
endon Jr. College Library. Mrs. 
White states that the following 
books are being catalogued at the 
present time but will be ready for 
checking out Wednesday, Novem­
ber 15th.

“Anna and The King of Siam” 
by Margaret Landon; “Cluny 
Brown” by Margery Sharp; “Peo­
ple On Our Side” by Edgar Snow; 
“Pastorial” by Nevil Shute; ‘The 
Sad Sack” by Sgt. George Baker; 
"Young’un” by Herbert Best; 
“Tall Talk From Texas” by Boyce 
House; “The American Character” 
by D. N. Brogan; “The World of 
Washington Irving” by Van Wyck 
Brooks; “The Joy of Cooking" by 
Irma S. Rombauer; “Your World 
Tomorrow” by Donald G. Cooley; 
“Basic History of the United 
States" by Charles and Mary 
Reed; “Here is Your War” by 
Ernie Pyle; “I Never Left Home" 
by Bob Hope; “Historical Atlas of 
the United States” by Clifford L  
Lord; "Air Navigation" by Her­
bert S. Zim; "Parachutes” by Her­
bert S. Zim; “The First Woman 
Doctor” by Rachel Baker; “Eisen­
hower, Man and Soldier” by Fran­
cis Miller; “Miracle of Military 
Medicine” by Albert Maisel; “The 
St. Louis Cardinals” by Frederick 
Lieb; "Walter Reed, Doctor in 
Uniform” by Laura Wood; "Stor­
ies of School and College Life” by 
Robert Cadigan; "English Social 
History" by George Trevelyon; 
“Nancy Naylor; Flight Nurse” by 
Elizabeth Lansing; “Ann Bartlett 
in the South Pacific” by Martha 
Johnson; “The Building of Jalna" 
by Ma^o de la Roche; “Brave 
Men” by Ernie Pyle.

BOB HARVEY
PAINTER A PAPERHANGER

Call 130 R

JR. HIGH NEWS
Lola Bess Braddock from Lelia 

Lake has entered school.
Arrvwdtng ♦« Seven-one the 

carnival was a success.
Scharlean and Benny Pyeatt, 

both of Eight-two have moved to 
Amarillo. We hate to see them 
leave.

Billy Jack Cornell got his wrist 
broken playing football.

The candidates for Queen are: 
Peggy Wright, Ladelle Cox, and 
Sybil Head.

Gossip
Betty Jean Naylor was very sad 

Tuesday night. I wonder why??
• Fred, is that an image of you 

sitting on your desk? You know, it 
does look like you.

Two people in Nine-two are 
pretty tired of writing sentences. 
Maybe they won’t talk anymore.

BRONCHOS vs. IRISHMEN
Friday night, October 3, 1944 

the Bronchos met the Irishmen of 
Shamrock in one of the most out­
standing games of the season. On 
the first kick off the Irishmen re­
ceived. The Irishmen came out of 
the first half with .12 points to our 
0. In the last half the Bronchos 
gained 7 points and the Irishmen 
6. The final score was 18 to 7. The 
whole team played a splendid 
game. Harrison came out with a 
small injury but was sent back in. 
Cowan with the support of his 
team mates, made our touchdown 
and Bentley kicked the point. The 
Band and Pep-squad did their

share. The Band and Pcp-squad 
will accompany the Bronchos this 
Friday night to Memphis. We are 
going to Memphis to win and we 
w ill Isn't that right, Bm wh«w?

Donley County Leader, >2 s year.

___ Thursday. November f. 1844
Mrs. Cora Wheatley of Lelia 

Lake underwent a major opera­
tion last Monday at Cleburne,
Texas. She will be moved from 
Uus Veil/***’ to the home of her 
daughter, Mrs. Jack Peggram of 
that city.

mi....

if
DR. H. R. BECK

D E N T I S T

Phone 44

8 to 13—Office hours—1 

Goldston Bldg. 

Clarendon. T<
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WE ARE PREPARED TO SAVE YOU TIME 
AND MONEY ON YOUR

AUTO GLASS
CUT TO FIT WHILE YOU WAIT

Prepare for Winter Now

GIFTS and TOYS
A LIMITED SUPPLY—SHOP EARLY

WALLPAPER
PAINTS

WeWe carry the largest stock of QUALITY PAINTS AND 
WALLPAPER in this entire Area all priced to save yon
money.

SHOP AT THE

PAINT STORE
YOU ALWAYS SAVE AT

HUDSON & TAYLOR
P h o n e  82-M

C
a
P

a

*

* o '

“ReeUUf..
TO DO IKE 
WORK AT 
H O M E..

}
At ADVERTISED IN 

CHARM

Just what you need to  etjuip you 
y a

for a busy schedule! It's the popuUr 
 ̂edition of the tW-piecer bf 

JutUrd of Dallas. The stitd^d
weskit and slim-cut skin tailored 

w> *
t̂d flatter in the thrilling

colors of Botany Vel-O-Twill, 

100% virgin wooL Red with
Blue triA, Gold with Brown

'V  4
trim, Brown with Gold

trim, Blue with Red 

trim. Sizes 7 
to 1).

. . .  so that you can join the WACs— and free a man 
to fight. Know the thrill of wearing the trim, olive drab 
that«ets you apart a t the girl who puts her country flrstl 
In the meantime, Reddy Kilowatt will carry

• Making the housework easier for mother.

• Protecting and serving your family.

• Turning the wheels of industry that supply the 
planes, ships and all munitions of war.

There has been no shortage of electricity, so—Reddy 

can relieve you, and you can relieve a fighting man.

P /u g  In  . . .  I'm  R e d d y !

WfestTexas Utilities Company
Greene Dry Goods 

Company
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GOLDSTON ♦ 
♦

♦  Wilma Smith e
M M R p t  •  ♦  ♦  ♦  ♦  ♦  ♦  ♦  ♦

There was 62 at Sunday school 
Sunday. We welcome them all 
back.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Dilli and 
children and Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Stewart and Gilbert visited in the 
Edd Mooring home Friday night.

Mr. W. W. Roy visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Houston McDonald Thursday 
night and Friday.

Mr. Tom Mott and Mr. Adkin- 
son of Amarillo visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Dilli Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob McGough of 
California is visiting her sister 
and husband, Mr. and Mrs. Mur­
phy Brock.

Mr. Pope is visiting in McLean 
at this time.

Mr. and Mrs. Neely Hudson and 
Dwayne visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Howard Stewart and children 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Brock and 
daughters visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Murphy Brock Sunday.

Dorothy Baker spent Sunday 
with Carolyn McBrayer.

Joe Wayne Dilli visited L. M. 
Putman Sunday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Smith visited 
Mr. and Mrs. J. S. Baker Sunday.

Mr. rnrfMr* fjerter BMaMe and 
children visited Mr. and Mrs. H. C. 
Smith Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Houston McDon­
ald and children visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe DUh Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Mooring and 
Genella visited Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Stewart Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Odell McBrayer 
visited Mr. and Mrs. J. S. Baker 
Sunday night.

Wilma Smith spent Wednesday 
night with Juanita and Naoma 
Mooring.

Chow Time in Burma

Dinner guests in the Longan 
home Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Longan and children, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Longan and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Lon­
gan and Peggy, Mr. and Mrs. J. T. 
Lamberson and boys, Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald Harlan.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Longan
and children, Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
Longan and Peggy spent Saturday 
night with their mother, Mrs 
Edith Longan.

A FEED for EVERY NEED
When you dm<1 any kind of food for stock or poultry bo 
sure to inspect our stock, for wo guarantee it to be {

Custom Grinding
We are equipped to do your grinding any way y«o 
It done. Profit more by grinding,

FU L L  LIN E OF LEG EA R 'S  PRO D U CTS

Thomas Mill & Feed Store

•  A rm y Signal Corpi Photo
These hnmky young Americans are part of Gen. Joe Stillwell’s Burma Task Force that Is fightlnr In the 
steaming jungles of Burma against the Nips. Here you see a company halted for chow. Our Army Is the best 
fed In the world due to the purchases won make of W: 'due to the purchases wou make ar Bonds. From U. S. Trotm ry

Mrs. Geo. Bain and two sons 
Joe and Gene of Dumas and a 
daughterinlaw, Mrs. Billy Bain 
and baby, spent Thursday in the 
J. D. Wood home. Gene Bain is 
in the Navy.

Mr. and Mrs. R. B. Lilly, Mr. 
and Mrs. F. A. Traweek of Crow­
ell. visited Sunday in home of Mr. 
and Mrs. C. W. Martin. Mr. Tra­
week is a brother of Mrs. Martin.

FOR BEST SELECTION OF GIFT FURNITURE
YOU CAN USE - Our Lay-A way Plan

BUY MORE WAR BONDS

KROEHLER L IV IN G  ROOM SUITES------ handaom a. soundly  constructed
chairs  and  sofa, upho lstered  In a ttra c tiv e , long-w earing  fabrics. A ll our 
fu rn itu re  is m ade w ith  ex p e rt w orkm ansh ip .
L arge S election BED ROOM SU ITES - - th a t  lend  b ea u ty  to  any bedroom .’ 
B eau tifu l in  ev e ry  respect. A ll sty lee en d  k in d s of woods.

D IN ETTE SU ITES — K IT C H E N  CA B IN ETS — STOVES
OCCASIONAL ROCKERS and  C H A IR S — TABLES and LAM PS

USE OUR LAY-AWAY-PLAN NOW
SO YOU AND YOUR FAMILY WILL NOT BE DISAPPOINTED 

WHEN THE HOLIDAY SEASON ARRIVES

CLARENDON  
FURNITURE STORE

J LELIA LAKE J

Mrs. Glen Rudder of Hereford 
left Friday after visiting her 
mother, Mrs. C. G. Aten.

Mrs. J. C. Christal and Mrs. M. 
Tomlinson went to Memphis last 
Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Robert Leath­
ers are the proud parents of a 
baby girl bom last Friday. Her1 
name is Beverly Joanne.

Mr. and Mrs. W. I. Mcllroy 
spent the weekend with relatives 
at McLean.

Mrs. Perry Cruse of Dallas came 
Saturday to spend the week with 
her sister, Mrs. J. B. Reynolds.

Mrs. H. R. King Jr. of Estelline 
spent the weekend with relatives 
here.

Mrs. Vera Bullard of Amarillo is 
here visiting her daughter, Mrs. 
Joe Robert Leathers and new 
granddaughter, and other rela­
tives. • • • 41*

Mr. and Mrs. D. E. Leathers 
visited in Mem phis Sunday.

Mrs. Lee Usrey was called to 
Dimmitt last week by the death 
of an aunt.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Mace and 
Mr. and Mrs. Oswald Jones of 
Farwell arrived Saturday for a 
short visit with relatives here.

Mrs. Quinn Aten and Shirley 
and Mrs. Sam Roberts visited with 
relatives in Memphis Sunday.

Delbert Gentry left Monday for 
his home in Hugo, Okla.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Kennedy of 
Farwell spent the week here with 
relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. J.W. McDonald of 
Quitaque spent Sunday in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Adell Will­
iams.

Mrs. Elvin Phillips is quite ill 
and was moved to a hospital in 
Amarillo Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Travis Reeves and 
daughter, Mrs. Alexander and 
children of Dumas visited in the 
home of their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. W. C. Reeves Sunday.

M A R T I N
Mrs. Jack Eddings

We had a nice crowd out for 
Sunday school Sunday morning.

CpL and Mrs. Ray Allison and 
baby from Amarillo spent the 
week end with her-parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. L. M. Marshall. Miss 
LaVem Marshall also spent the 
week end with homefolks.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Moss and 
family from Goodnight, Mrs. 
Marie Rotan from Amarillo and 
Dorothy Terry, Mary Neal Davis, 
Joveda Roberts, Billy M. Hodnett, 
Margie Crofford, George and Gene 
Bulman and Billy J. Jordan spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. E. B.
Allen and C. A. Ellis Jr.

Mr. and Mrs. George Bulman 
and Helen Jo spent Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Tick Barbee at 
Groom.

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Morrow 
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
W. L. Jordan.

Mr. and Mrs. S. A. Eddings Sr., 
Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Bulman and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Eddings visit­
ed in the George Terry home 
Tuesday night.

The Hallowe’en party in the 
Christie home Tuesday night was 
well attended.

Mrs. J. H. Easterling and Mrs. 
Roy Morrow from El Paso are

visiting relatives in this commun­
ity.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Cannon 
spent Sunday in Memphis with 
his sisters.

Those visiting in the Pete Land 
home Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Arby Mulder and son from Floyd- 
ada, Mr. and Mrs. J. F. Minyard 
and children from Littlefield, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Minyard from Quail, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. G. Cobb and chil­
dren from Ashtola, Mr. and Mrs. 
W. H. Fitzgerald and children 
from Silverton, Mrs. Annie May 
from Austin, Mr. and Mrs. D. M. 
Fitzgerald from Clarendon, Mr. 
and Mrs. Rasco Land and grand­

son and Lee Lgnd and Miss Ruth 
Bond from Hedley.

Mr. and Mrs. Lou Bain are the 
proud parents of a baby girl since 
Nov. 4th. Mrs. Bain will be re- 
iiKoiiUacd &  MLs Christine Pitt­
man. ,

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Eddings and 
daughter and Mr. Alvin Pittman 
and Billy spent Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. U. G. Pittman.

Mrs. J. L. Hopkins and children 
Johnny and Cleta have gone to 
Allen, Texas to make their home 
Her sister, Lorane Spurgeon ac­
companied her there for a few 
days visit.

Mr; and Mrs. Cliff Stephens and 
Mrs. Doris Perkins spent the week 
end with Mrs. A. B. Stephens and 
Rhetta Ann in the Longan home.

Mrs. Tom Lane is at home from 
a hospital in Okla. She is reported 
as being as well as can be expect­
ed.

SHIPS NAMED AFTER 
GREAT AMERICANS
' The names of three great Amer­
icans, Wendell L. Willkie, George 
W. Norris and Alfred E. Smith, 
will be honored by being given 
to three new liberty ships now 
under construction, it is announc­
ed by the United States Maritime 
Commission.

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Stephens, 
Mrs. Doris Perkins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Longan, Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
Longan and Peggy. Mr. and Mrs. 
J. T. Lamberson ate supper in the 
Longan home Sat. night.

Mrs. Alfred Estlack went to 
Temple last week after her sister, 
Mrs. Jack Murff who is sick. They 
returned home Sunday night.

Mesdames John Blocker Sr., 
Johnny Blocker and Homer Mul- 
key were shopping in Amarillo 
Monday.

Be Quick To Treat 
* Bronchitis*

Chronic bronchitis may develop If 
your cough, chest cold, or acute bron­
chitis is not treated and you cannot 
a fiord to take a chance with any medi­
cine less potent than Creomulsion 
which goes right to the seat of the 
trouble to help loosen and expel germ 
laden phlegm and aid nature to 
soothe and heal raw, tender, Inflamed
h^ ^ u lsT T g re n "3 r tS ? X w o o d
creosote by special process with other 
time tested medicines for coughs. 
It contains no narcotics. •

No m atter how many medicines 
you have tried, tell your druggist to 
sell you a bottle of Creomulsion with 
the understanding you must like the 
way it quickly allays the cough, per­
mitting rest and sleep, or you are to 
have your money back. (Adv.)

1918 Armistice 1944
Can you remember peacetime? Can you remem­

ber the noisy joy-filled throngs that celebrated the 

Armistice Day that ended World War I? We’re 

celebrating that Armistice today—embroiled in 

World War II. And this is a different war: a peo­

ples war in which every civilian wages a fight. 

This war is going to be a fight to the finish of 

totalitarian, fascist power-lusting. This war is 

going to end with a more glorious Armistice than 

the last—because when this war ends, liberty’s 

torch will be flaming brightly, and she’ll hold her 

head high—forever.

Donley c o u n t v
STATE BANK I

M*mb*r Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

PAY PROMPTLY KEEP YOUR CREDIT GOOD

Mix-Match
M ARVELS

TOPS FOR BUSY WARDROBEl

Slack* an d  W eskit, to  w ear together 

- - - team  endlessly  w ith  your e n ­

tire  w ardrobe. L arge selection of 

F a ll S lack Su its th a t w ill fill your 

ind iv idua l needa and  desire.

•  SW EATERS—All K inds
s

•  DRESSES— for S p o rt and  
Dress-up.

•  V arie ty  of PU R SES

•  LOVELY FA L L  SU ITS 

9  A T T R A CT IVE COATS

LOVELY LIN G ER IE 
P an ties, Slips, Gowns,

' H osiery  — also g irls  P an ties.

BRYAN CLOTHING CO.
LA D IES and  M EN S W EAR
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♦ WORTH WHILE ♦
♦ COMMENTS ♦
♦ ---------  ♦
♦  BY COUNTY AGENT ♦
♦  Charles O. Reea ♦
♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦ ♦

Notice Cotton Farmers
The last straw that broke the 

camel's back is a familiar fable to 
all of us.

The compresses in this area are 
requesting the cotton farmers and

gins to co-operate vrtth the com­
press to reduce the number of 
large bales being sent to compress. 
Compress machinery was design­
ed for 900 lb. bales which is U.S. 
standard weight. Compress ma­
chinery can handle bales ranging 
in weight from 400 to 600 lbs. but 
prefer the 500 lb. average bale.

Last year due to many causes 
the cotton farmers ginned a larg­
er number of bales that weighed 
over 600 lbs. These bales caused 
compresses many headaches, trou- 

1 ble. breakdowns and delays. A-

T h e re ’s a Shortage of 
Copies of T h e  Dallas 
M o rn in g  News— B a t N O T  
of O n r D esire  to Serve!

The crucial shortage of newsprint paper 
has forced a curtailment of the supply of 
copies of The Dallas Morning News to our 
dealers In this county. Only a small part 
of regular shipments Is possible until we 
are permitted by Government Authority to 
Increase our consumption of newsprint.

Distribution for the present will be made 
from drug stores and newsstands, unless 
your agent can arrange otherwise.

We realize, with deep regret, that some 
of our old-time readers are not able to get 
copies of The News. We trust they will 
understand and bear with us while we're 
making every effort to restore service.
P In the meantime, although many patrons 
wW not have The News delivered to them 
temporarily, their names are still on The 
Dellas News' Big Book and we look forward 
to serving them again.

yom.

' 01) t Sallas pbrmitQ JWtys!

YAMS
10 LBS................................................................. 49c
PORK & BEANS
MARSHALL— 16 O Z ......................................... 10c
REX JELLY
V, GALLON ....................................................... 59c
CORN SUGAR
3 POUNDS........................................................ 25c
SHORTENING
BAKE RITE 3 LBS............................................ 69c
APPLES
LARGE ROMAN BEAUTY—P O U N D ........... 10c
TOMATOES
(20 points!)—NO. 2 C A N ............................. 10c
BEANS
NEW PINTOS— 10 LBS..................................... 85c
ONIONS
YELLOW—PO U N D ....................................... 3 * c
SYRUP
BUSS Wamo—5 LBS........................................ 42c
COFFEE

MAXWELL HOUSE—3 LBS.
$100

FLOUR
GOLD MEDAL Fresh Shipment—25 LBS. .

$125

CABBAGGE
LARGE FIRM HEADS—PO UN D ................. 3 !/zc
SOUP
CAMPBELLS TOMATO—C A N ...................... 10c
LARD CANS 59c
RIB ROAST
POUND .............................................................. 19c
STEAK
FOREQUARTER—POUND ............................. 26c
BULK MINCE MEAT
POUND .............................................................. 29c

gain this year the compresses have 
been receiving a large number of 
bales weighing over 600 lbs. with 
more breakdowns.

To reduce lite number of break­
downs and delays caused by bales 
weighing over 600 lbs. the com­
presses are requesting cotton pro­
ducers and ginners to co-operate 
with them to help bales under 
600 lbs.

Talk this over with your neigh­
bors and gin managers.

Ceiling Prices, Hogs
OPA announced effective Oc­

tober 30, 1944 ceiling prices on
hogs weighing less than 240 lbs. 
has been raised to 270 lbs. for ceil­
ing price 14.75 per cwt., Chicago 
basis.

This change was made because 
present production below antici­
pated production of hogs, and ap­
parently more feed available.

WEEKLY CROP 
LETTER

Donley County Agent, Charles 
Reed has received the following 
report for the week ending Ofc- 
tober 27.

Labor for feed harvest and trac­
tor drivers is still in demand in 
the Panhandle Wheat area. Coun­
ties wanting this type of labor 
are: Hartley, Ochiltree, Sherman, 
Gray, Randall, Hemphill, Hutch­
inson, Oldham, Briscoe, Castro, 
Hale, Parmer and Swisher. Ser­
vice men are harvesting feed in 
Dalian* Armstrong, and Potter 
counties.

All counties in the High Plains 
Cotton Area need cotton pullers. 
This need varies from 400 in 
Hockley County to 3500 in Lamb 
County.

Cotton pullers are urgently 
needed in all of the major cotton 
producing counties of the Rolling 
Plains Area. Pulling is near the 
peak in Hall County. Cotton will 
be sledded in Collingsworth Coun­
ty if additional labor does not 
come in.

Cotton pickers are still needed 
in all of the North Texas black- 
land counties, and in most of the 
central part of this area. However, 
the situation is much better with 
70 percent of the Dallas, 60 per­
cent of the Ellis and 75 percent of 
the Lamar county crop picked. In 
the central part of the blackland. 
Bell county reports 70 per cent 
and Falls county 40 per cent of 
the cotton crop picked. Labor is 
heeded in several counties Tor 
feed harvest.

Rice harvest has passed the 
peak in Orange county. Jefferson 
county needs additional rice 'har­
vest labor. Cotton pickers and 
pecan harvesters are wanted in 
Wharton county.

Tomato harvest is under way in 
Webb and Zapata counties. A 
shortage of irrigators exists in 
Zavala county.

Former Resident Passes Away
Word was received here Wed. 

morning that Mrs. John Watts 
died at Ft. Worth Wednesday at 
1:10 a. m. She will be buried at
Ft. Worth. Mrs. Watts lived in 
Clarendon for several years.

Bob Johnson and his mother re­
turned home from Mineral Wells 
Wednesday, where they were call­
ed to attend a funeral of a rela­
tive.

Mr. and Mrs. Marian Cox of 
Panhandle visited her mother, 
Mrs. A. H. Baker Tuesday. Mr. 
Cox returned home. Mrs. Cox left 
today for her home.

Mrs. J. A. Warren returned 
home Tuesday from Amarillo 
where she had been for several 
days on account of the illness of 
her daughter, Mrs. Paul Hollings­
worth.

J. J. Carlile left Sunday for 
Albuquerque, N. M. in response to 
a telegram advising him of the 
death of a sister there.

by U. S. War Department. Bureau of Public Halation#.

RICKSHAW-RIDING WACS IN INDIA—First WACS who arrived for duty at the Eastern Air 
Command headquarters were given a tour of Calcutta to familiarise them with the city and facilities 
available during their recreat'”” '-curs. Left to right. Pvt Dorothy Luft, Wilkes-Barre, Pa., and Pfc. 
Margaret L. Solum, Long P

Mrs. L. L. Wood visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Brown 
of Claude last Wednesday.

Those attending the Grand 
Chapter order of the Eastern Star 
last week at Ft. Worth were Mes- 
dames Joe Bownds, Van Kennedy, 
Joe Ritter, Heckle Stark, Maggie 
Hunt and Mr. and Mrs. Chas. 
Balrfield.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Connally 
from San Antonio have moved 
here and will have an apartment

Dr. B. L. Jenkins is in Dallas 
spending the week end with his 
son, Dr. and Mrs. Oscar Jenkins.

Mrs. Easterling and daughter, 
Mrs. Roy Barrow of ElPaso spent 
last week visiting relatives here 
in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Arlie Wood and 
daughter and Mrs. L. L. Wood 
were Amarillo shoppers Tuesday.

Z. N. Williams spent last week 
with his daughter, Mrs. Lewis 
Busby and family at Lockney, re­
turning home Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Heatherly 
spent Sunday in Amarillo with 
relatives and friends.

For Good Insurance

KELLY
C H A M B E R L A IN
All Types-—All Kinds 

P R O M P T  A D JU S T M E N T S  

C la r e n d o n ,  T e x a n

John and Frank Hermesmeyer 
were down from Jericho Tuesday 
attending business matters.

Ration Reminder
MEATS, FATS—Red stamps A8 

through Z8 and A5 through K5, 
good indefinitely. L5 through P5 
become good October 29 and re­
main good indefinitely. No new 
stamps until December 3rd.

PROCESSED FOODS — Blue 
stamps A8 through Z8 and A5 
through R5, good indefinitely. S5 
through W5 become good Novem­
ber 1st and remain good indefi­
nitely. No new stamps until De­
cember 1st.

SUGAR—Sugar stamps 30, 31, 
32 and 33, each good for five 
pounds indefinitely. Sugar stamp 
40, good for five pounds of can­
ning sugar through February, 
next year.

GASOLINE — A-13 coupons in 
new “A” book, good for four gal­
lons each thtpugh December 21.

SHOES—Airplane stamps 1 and 
2, good indefinitely. Airplane 
stamp 3 becomes good November 
1st and remains good indefinitely.

TICKET TO KANSAS CITY  
LEFT HERE FOR 
SOLDIER USE

If you know of a soldier that is 
going to Kansas City and can use 
a ticket, he can get one here at 
the Leader office.

Cpl. Chester A. Myers of Ash- 
tola received a change in orders 
while at home and had no use for 
the ticket, so he left it with us in 
case some soldier was going that 
way and could save that much 
money.

LIONS CLUB PROGRAM 
LEADERS ANNOUNCED

Rev. H. W. Hanks, chairman of 
the Lions Club program commit­
tee, announces the following men 
will have charge of programs on 
the respective dates listed.

Nov. 21—O. C. Watson
Nov. 28—Rev. John S. Ellis.

i1 1 1  lilil!

AT

t m . M
S Y S T E M

a n d
S A V E

c a l i f 6 r n i a

LEMONS
DOZEN

2 9 c

SHORTENING 7 7  c
K. B.—4 lbs. M ■  w

CORN—Cream style 1 5  C
M arshall—No. 2 C an ............................................................................

FLOUR $119
A m ary llis—25 lbs. ........................................................................  .............L arg a  S lsa

TOMATOES
POUND

1 5 c

spuds 4 9 c
U.S. No. 1— 10 lbs. ■  * *  W

PANCAKE FLOUR 4 f t  
White Swan—20 os. Pkg............  1 V C

0  ATS f t f t
White Swan—Large S i t e ..........a V v

CANE SYRUP I f l , ,  
Old Plantation—No. 2 Can l U C

COFFEE Q f  
White Swan—Pound O w C

LETTUCE CREAM OF WHEAT 4 C CORN FLAKES "J

ICEBERG
HEAD

1 2 c

Quick or regular 1 t I L White Swan—11 ox. Box f  C

YAMS 9 c
N ew  C rop Eaat T exas—P o u n d .................................................................

TOMATOES 1C R ISPY . KRUNCHY

CELERY
LARGE STALK

2 1 c

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 
THE AMOUNT OF ANY ITEM

Fancy PEAS
Concho—No. 2 C an 1 5 c

M  E  H E R  £

WE HAVE HOME KILLED BEEF AND PORK

STEW MEAT
Pound ............. Me
STEAK
T-Bona—Pound 39c
PICNIC HAMS
Pound ................ 29c

O LEO
Nu - Maid—Pound 23c
BEEF ROAST A F
Good Quality, your cut—Pound L w C

FRESH EGGS
D ossn ............. 41c

PI III! I‘!l III mil ttllU !i it |i(!1I|MNHI!I I Mill Ml!'1 'I



THE DONLEY COUNTY 
LEADER bring* t o u t  
friends and acquaintances 
near you every weak. 
Keep your subscription 
paid up at ail times. Be 
sure to check your data 
line closely every week.

A  FAM ILIAR FIGHTER AND ITS
> SUCCESSOR

n d e g  C o t m ln
A friend to the farmer, his home and his family. A champion of his rights and a willing promoter of his interests.

Buy More 
WAR BONDS 

and
S T A M P S

CLARENDON, DONLEY COUNTY, TEXAS, NOVEMBER 9, 1944 A Common Paper for Common People

United Council of Church Women 
Give Report On Clothing Drive

star as having participated in the 
assault of Europe.

The Emergency Clothing Drive 
for the relief of the destitute in 
war-torn countries, sponsored by 
the United Nations Relief Ad­
ministration closed two weeks 
ago. Churches of all denomina­
tions took part in this most wor­
thy project and the United Coun­
cil of Church Women worked as 
an organized unit, in its behalf; 
and throughout the country were 
responsible for splendid contribu­
tions. The Church Council of Clar­
endon and many friends sent a 
total of 715 garments, weighing 
661 lbs. Every garment was ex­
amined and packed according to 
the regulations specified. Those 
garments which could not be 
used (shoes in particular) were 
turned over to the Red Cross 
Emergency Relief, so any one and 
every one contributing shared in 
helping someone unfortunate.

Deep appreciation for the splen­
did interest and response is ex­
pressed by Mrs. Millard Word, 
president of the Council, and es­
pecially to the students of Claren­
don High School and Junior Col­
lege, to Mr. Frank Phelan who of­
fered his pickup for his company

workers, Mr. Allmond and Mr. 
Bingham, and Rev. Ellis who tied 
all the 22 cartons, and for each 
council member who helped with 
the sorting and packing, and to 
all connected in any way towards 
making this drive a success.

“We are especially appreciative 
to the Donley County Leader,’’ 
Mrs. Word stated, “in their co­
operation in helping us reach peo­
ple throughout the county.”

MOST BOX MATCHES 
TO ARMED FORCES

Hold that light, mister, will 
continue to be the popular phrase 
in coming months, according to a 
War Production Board report 
which states that about 90 percent 
of all penny box matches and 25 
per cent of all book matches pro­
duced in the next six months will 
be delivered to the armed forces. 
Although few penny box matches 
will be available to civilians dur­
ing this period, matches of the 
household “strike anywhere” type 
will be produced in sufficient 
quantity to meet all civilian 
needs. WPB said.

Following allied ground forces 
in the race toward Germany, 
Havoc light bombers, the Ninth 
Air Force weapon of ground sup­
port and medium bombardment, 
have moved to France. With them 
wentt the aligned units of the 
Ninth Air Force Service Com­
mand. The Service Group under 
command of Lt. Colonel Ray Fish­
er, Karfsas City, combined in 
maintenance and supply of a tac­
tical organization of the two- 
engined aircraft, moved from the 
United Kingdom with ton upon 
ton of heavy equipment, all of 
which is designed to sustain Hav­
oc missions now into the heart of 
the Reich.

Master Sgt. Marcus Putman, 
Bayside, Texas, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Marcus Putman of Claren­
don, is a member of the service 
unit now in France. His training 
in service and maintenance, com­
bining technical and tactical ex­
perience has gone into the group 
which has been commanded by 
numerous superior headquarters 
and recommended for the battle

S e le c t
A FUNERAL DIRECTOR

gA. lycut uxO-ulA

A DOCTOR

I T

w i * ' . •

■£ •
&  *  *  V

Your fam ily physician to a 
o f  a b i l i t y ,  with a

Arm y Sig n a l Cotpa Pboto
Men of the famous and feared Americal Division are shown burning out a  Jap machine run nest In a 
pillbox on Bougainville bland. These boys play for keeps the Nips know now. Back them up by buying an 
extra War Bond today. From U. S. Tiaaaurr

New Medical 
Examiner 
Appointed

Capt. F. C. Buffington has been 
appointed chief of the Flight Sur­
geon’s examining unit at Patter­
son Field, 111.

An aviation medical examiner 
who has been assigned to Station 
Hospital, Capt. Buffington suc­
ceeds Capt. Elias D. Peelle, who 
has left Fairfield Air Service 
Command for another assignment.

In his new position Capt. Buff­
ington supervises all physical ex­
aminations of officer* and enlisted 
men for Headquarters, Air Ser­
vice Command, FASC and the 
base.

Capt. Buffington came to Pat­
terson Field in May of this year 
from Randolph Field, Texas, 
where he completed training in 
the School of Aviation Medicine. 
Prior to his studies there he was 
stationed at Jefferson Barracks, 
Mo.

The new appointee entered the 
army July 8, 1942. He was en­
gaged in private practice in Nor­
man, Okla., his home city, before 
that date. A graduate of the Uni­
versity of Oklahoma medical 
school, he interned at Wisconsin 
General Hospital, Madison, Wis. 
He is married to the former 
Eunice Griggs, formerly of Clar­
endon.

o f Dm  train­
ing and valuable expert-

It to wtoa to select ■ fa- 
neral director with the 
■ante car*. HI* ab ility , 
training and experience to 
equally important.
Our many year* of sank a
fas this com munity, will, 
we believe, qualify n* to 
mart the above require­
ments. Many have thanked 
ns far the kindness, cour­
tesy and tact at time af 
life’s greatest trial. We in-

Wa are the only 
licensed Embalmer* 
in Donley County.

Mr. and Mr*. Fred Buntin
Cadillac Ambulance Service

Phone ISO

"W e hope it won’t  be long before Daddy comes home. W ouldn’t that be good news?, 
But to Daddy the best news will be th a t he’ll get his old job back when he 
comes home. Then we’ll all be happily united again.”

Yes . • . every one of our men and women on leave w ith our fighting 
forces can come back to us. And th a t can’t  be too soon for us. I t  will be a happy 
day when they rejoin our organization, again helping to serve the peacetime natu ra l 
gas needs of the G ulf South.

UNITED GAS PIPE LINE COMPANY ,
and Associated Companies
U N I T E D

NOVEMBER TIRE f
QUOTA INCREASED

The November quota of new 
automobile tires allocated by the 
War Production Board will be 
1,850,000 or 250,000 more than in 
October, it is announced by the 
Office of Price Administration 
and War Production Board. “As 
near as we can tell, this quota 
should satisfy normal November 
replacement needs of eligible “B” 
and “C” ration holders,” Max Mc­
Cullough, Deputy OPA Rationing 
Administrator said. He pointed 
out that the ration quota this 
month makes it “clear that recap­
ping will still be necessary for 
most motorists if they are to keep 
their cars in operation.” Unfilled 
"B” and “C” tire applications, 
needed increases in dealer inven­
tories and a higher production 
rate are required before “A” ra­
tion holders can expect new tires.

PAPER SHORTAGE 
TO CONTINUE

fii

—On Pay Day* Buy Bonds—

J
VI

1

AT
)

The public can expect no relief 
from existing paper shortages un­
til about the middle of 1945 be­
cause of the heavy wartime re­
quirements of newsprint, maga­
zines and book paper and the 
manpower shortages in this indus­
try, the War Production Board re­
ports.

I
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26th ANNIVERSARY

' '

As we reach the twenty-sixth anniversary of Armistice Day our thoughts turn to the Un­
known Soldier in Arlington Cemetery and the sacrifice he and thousands of other Americans 
of our generation made to beat back hordes of Germany making their bid for world domina­
tion under kaiserism.
Today, our sons are engaged in the business of meeting in the breach a new generation of that 
same ruthless foe, again seeking to bend to their will the freedom-loving nations of the world. 
The gangsters of Berlin and Tokyo would set the clock back a thousand years and condemn 
our children and our children’s children to a servitude which would be unbelievable did not 
the peoples of Poland, Czecho-Slovakia, Manchuria and the Philippines, and other nations 
under the Axis heel provide the most heart-rendering of testimony.
* « • *  ̂ i ■

Against this ruthless totalitarianism we of the United Nations have mustered the might of 
decent people everywhere b a grim determbation to smash once and for all the recurring 
threat to all we have and are.

»  -1

THE FOLLOWING BUSINESS FIRMS AND CITIZENS PAY HONOR TO OUR DEPARTED COMRADES.

Douglas & Goldston 
Drug Co.

THE REXALL STORE

DRUGS FOUNTAIN SERVICE 
Phono 36 W « tm  Union

RHODES & ROACH
GAS OILS FEED 

INDEPENDENT CREAM BUYERS

Womack Burial Ass’n.
HARRY WOMACK. Ownor. U.S.M 

Clarendon Memphis
Hedley McLm b

■ Phono 94

Kelly Chamberlam
I N S U R A N C E  

CLARENDON. TEXAS

West Texas Utilities Co.
EVERYTHING ELECTRICAL

Clarendon Press
Grooting Cordo P«n-T»lW P»p*r

GENERAL PRINTING 

Phono 66-J

E. F. (Bert) SMITH 
GIN CO.

CLARENDON LEL1A LAKE

DAVI S
Bumper to Bumper

SERVICE STATION 

Phono 197
1______ Z / i F i O a  - M

BETTER TRACTORS-. 

BETTER TRADES

CLEO WOODS
DEPENDABLE ££RVICE

Surface Burial Vault Co.
Vaults • Monuments • Grave Slabs 

and Curbing 
L. L. WALLACE

Phono: Day 99-A Night 99-B

McCrary Grocery & Mkt
TRADE HERE AND SAVE 

PHONE 61-M

Carpenter’s Garage
GENERAL REPAIRING 

Phono S3-R

Thomas Feed Store
POULTRY AND DAIRY FEEDS 

PHONE 491

Donley County 
State Bank

WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS

To the Memory of Our 
Departed Comrades

AUBYN E. CLARK *
ROY BOSWELL *
ERNEST NELSON *
JOE SAWYER i f  
JUDIE DINGLER *
F. L  SNODGRASS* 
ROSCOE GHOLSON *
O. G. SPIER *
WILL HIESLER 

HOMER STOCKING 

C. W. CLAYTON 
BERT E. CALCOTE 

BERNIE F. BALDWIN 
ESTIL B. MILLER 
LUTHER BLEVINS . 
FRANK COLLINSON JR. 
WILLIS W. COOPER 

H. M. CHRISTIANSON 

FRED LYNN.
HARLEY B. SKINNER 

THOMAS E. NAYLOR 

CURTIS E. THOMPSON 
HENRY TICE 
WALTER A. WILSON 
WALTON TUCKER 
RAYMOND HAY

Aubyn E. Clark Pott No. 126

AMERICAN LEGION
TOM TUCKER. Poat Commander
B. C. ANTROBUS. Adjutant 
G. O. REEVES, let Vice Comdr.
R. W. MOORE. 2nd Vico Comdr. 
NEWT WALDRON. 3rd Vico Comdr.
C. J. DOUGLAS, Service Officer 
J. D. STOCKING. Hietorian
F. E. CARAWAY. Chaplain
R. L. SMITH. 8gt.-Arme
C. M. LOWRY. Child Welfaro Chm.

—Executive Committee—
NATHAN COX 
CLYDE PRICE 
H. T. BURTON

J.C. BUTLER
J E W E L E R

Goldston Building 
Clarendon. Texaa

SUE’S CAFE
J. D. SUE. Prop.

White Why Laundry
PHONE 34-M

Thompson Bros. Co.
HARDWARE AND FARM EQUIPMENT

Clarendon Hedley

Bryan Clothing Co.
MEN’S WEAR

ALSEA CABINS
W. C. GUNTER. Prop. 

Phone 268-M

LON RUNDELL
ALLIS-CHALMERS TRACTORS

WETMORE *  PAPEC FEED GRINDERS 
BUY THE BE8T

Greene Dry Goods Co.
READY-TO-WEAR, MILLINERY 

CLOTHING, SHOES, ETC. 

PHONE 41

Bennett Implement Co.
JOHN DEERE IMPLEMENTS

Irene’s Beauty Shop
PHONE 234-J

CLOTHING '' HARDWARE

Noblitt Sales Company
FARM & HOME SUPPLIES

Purina Feeds Butane-Propane Gee

PARSONS BROS.
C L E A N E R S

BEACH AUTO STOl
SEE “OTTO” FOR YOUR “AUTO”

PHONE 25

Farmers State Bank
Capital Stock $50,000

CLARENDON. TEXAS 
Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corp.

4 M .
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THE FOLLOWING BUSINESS FIRMS ANDCITIZENS PAY HONOR TO OUR DEPARTED COMRADES.

DRINK

IN BOTTLES

IF IT'S HEAT
It can be dona battar with Natural Gas.

CITY GAS CO.
CLARENDON DISTRICT 

Clarandon Hadlay Lalia Laka

QUAUTY BUILDING MATERIAL

C. D. Shamburger 
.Lumber Co.
CLARENDON. TEXAS •

R. R. DAWKINS
BLACKSM1THING ft WELDING

Sinclair Refining Co.
S. W. LOWE. Agant

Palmer Motor Company

T T " — . "  ■

DeLuxe Cleaners
Waltar Haglar v ' Milton Shaver

: !»♦t v i * t of. • jS

Norwood Pharmacy
RELIABLE PRESCRIPTION SERVICE 

CLARENDON. TEXAS

M SYSTEM
GROCERY ft MARKET 

1 PHONE 193

First National Bank
CAPITAL A SURPLUS 991.000

Da posits insursd undar FDIC

W. H. PATRICK. President 
W. W. TAYLOR. V-Pres. & Cashier 
R. S. WHITE, Assistant Cashier

OLIN BAIN
Service Station

•
PHILLIPS 66 PRODUCTS

• ; v’ %
Whole*ala k RataU 

Phone 19-J

BUD ANDERSON
Garage
PHONE 4 0 -/

GEO. B. BAGBY
LIFE INSURANCE

B.F.KIRTLEY
EVERYTHING IN LEATHER

American Legion 
Auxiliary
OFFICERS 1944

MRS. EARL LEA. President 
MRS. JOE HOLLAND, lit  V-Praa.. . . r f  . , ,

MRS. D. F. WADSWORTH, 2nd V-Pree. 
MRS. RAYBURN SMITH. Secretary 
MRS. FLEM CARAWAY. Chaplain 
MRS. TOM TUCKER. Sgt.-Arma 

MISS EULA NAYLOR. Historian

Lump’s Fountain 

J. R. PORTER, Atty. 

McGowan Barber Shop
J . A. WARREN, INCOME TAX SERVICE

“Sugar Bowl” for sweets

W. 0. BUTLER 

0DUS CARAWAY
. " • 1 * I

SANFORD GROCERY

H. MULKEY ESTATE
Pastime &  Cozy Theatres

LEE BELL, Manager

Watson & Antrobus
HARDWARE, HOUSE FURNISHINGS, 

PLUMBING

ANTRO HOTEL

Clarendon Furniture 
Store

COMPLETE HOUSE FURNISHINGS

A. J. PARKER
5c to $1.00 STORE

. . ;  . . \ 1 * 
HOMER BONES

GENERAL AUTO REPAIR 

BATTERY AND ELECTRIC

Simpson’s Feed Mill GUY WRIGHT CLIFFORD & RAY
Whan in the market tor feed grinding, 
mixing and processing feeds of all

GROCERIES ft MEATS 

FROZEN FOOD LOCKERS 

WE DELIVER PHONE 5

P1GGLY WIGGLY
CLARENDON. TEXAS

F. J. Hommel Serv. Sta. 

C. C. Powell, Abstracts

FRANK WHITE Jr. Hudson & Taylor

Farmers Exchange
GROCERIES ft MARKET

WE DELIVER Ph o n e  83-j

C. E. Killougb, Abstracts 

Donley County N.F.L.A.

E-Z LAUNDRY 

J. T. Patman & Son, Ins. 

Alderson Art Studio

WALLPAPER ft PAINT 

PHONE 92-M

HOWERTON CAFE
AT

DAVIS BUMPER TO BUMPER STATION

Buntin Burial Ass’S.
ORGANIZED 1*34 

PHONE 190-A

RALPH KEYS

ERNEST TAYLOR

SIMMONS POWELL
GULF PRODUCTS 

WHOLESALE AND RETAIL

Clarendon Motor Co.

PHONE 400

Johnson Welding and 
Machine Works

WE CAN DO THE JOB 

JUST BRING IT TO US
\ * t { it \

Foxworth-Galbraith 
Lumber Co.

QUALITY BUILDING MATERIALS 

Phone 21‘

HOLLAND BROS.
Service Station

MAGNOLIA PRODUCTS

LEE’S CAFE

Clarendon Food Store
GROCERIES & MARKET

PHONE 43

DR. H. R. BECK
D E N T I S T

Swinney Shoe Shop
EXPERT REPAIRING

Beneath Hawk'* Room*

Goldston & Brumley
J E W E L E R S  

JOE GOLDSTON, Optometrl*

These Armistice Day pages sponsored by Aubyn E. Clark Poft 126 American Legion. Our Post has always sponsored everything 
that is good for Community, State and Na tion.—B. C. ANTROBUS, Adj.
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—Or put it in The Texas Cotton Growers

Have a “Coke”=Ahoy, majtes
—And we will buy your Cotton

—Or will put it in Government Loan

Loan at Hedley
t

We Deliver your cotton at Hedley Free

Both the Japs and Nazis have 
been catching it hot and heavy 
lately—and so many Texans are 
in the fight that even the enemy 
never knows when one will turn 
up. So many Texans are serving 
in the Royal Canadian Air Force 
(they joined before the U. S. en­
tered the war( that some corres­

pondents refer to it as the "Royal 
Texas Air Force.”

Incidentally. Sgt Steve Hour- 
ihan, son of Mr. and Mrs. J. T. 
Hourihan of Balmorhea, has set 
some sort of a record in this war. 
A mechanic and gunner aboard a 
B-24 Liberator flying from South- 

| ern Italy, he has completed 300 
combat missions and helped drop 
more than 13,000 tons of bombs on 
the enemy. His group has two 
presidential citations.

J. W. Woodward of Athens has 
been returned to the U. S. after 
18 months in the Southwest Pa­
cific, where he was twice wound­
ed and awarded the Purple Heart 
and Oak Leaf Cluster. Lt. Charles 
Brandon of Pecos, assistant oper 
ations officer of a B-24 Liberator

ACTIVELY INTERESTED IN BEING 
OF REAL SERVICE TO YOU

Make the
“First National Bank”

YOUR BANK

It's plaaaant to know, when you walk in our Bank 
you w ill be served by a Friend with a Friend's in ­
terest in your problems.

BUY MORE WAR BONDS - - - AND KEEP THEM

First National Bank
Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

group in England, has completed 
100 missions in only 140 days. 
That’s flying)

And word comes now that Pvt. 
Frank Lozano of Manor, who has 
been missing in action since July 
31, is a prisoner of war in Ger­
many.

Most American anti-aircraft 
units have had little actual fight­
ing during the sweep across 
France into Germany, due to the 
fact that few Nazi planes dared 
oppose our air fighters, but the 
unit of Corp. Bill Ammons Jr., of 
Lefors, is an exception. That out­
fit has shot down several German 
planes, and is still on the move to­
ward Berlin.

Capt. Irby Dyer of Monahans, 
a bomber pilot stationed in Italy, 
has won an unusual distinction. 
For several months he has work­
ed in close collaboration with 
Yugoslav airmen. Now he has 
been made an honorary member 
of the Yugoslav Air Force, and 
wears the RYAF wings in addi­
tion to those given him by Uncle 
Sam. Dyer is a former Pecos at­
torney.

From Briggs, Texas, comes 
news that Mr. and Mrs. Kyle 
Smith have been notified that 
their son, Pvt. Floyd B. Smith, 
was slightly wounded in fighting 
inside Germany. But he expects 
to recover in time for the march 
into Berlin)

J. A. WARREN
AGENCY

INSURANCE •  BONDS

NOTARY PUBLIC

COMPLETE INCOME TAX 
8 E R V I C E  

(25 years’ experience)

Social Security k  Withholding 
Tax Reports

FREE CONSULTATION
Offices: Goldston Building, 

Clarendon, Te

CLARENDON CIN
DEPENDABLE GINNERS

- GIN WITH US -

New Plasma 
Technique For 
Wounded

A new technique has been de­
veloped in combat areas whereby 
blood plasma is administered in 
four places in a man’s body sim­
ultaneously, in order to get it into 
him quickly enough to save his 
life, it was reported in a General 
Electric Science Forum address 
here by Lieut. Allan A. Fisher, 
U. S. Navy surgeon assigned to 
the Schenectady Red Cross blood 
donor center.

"One bettle of plasma is fed
into each arm and one bottle is 
fed to the patient in each leg," 
said Lt. Fisher. ’That should give 
us some idea of the importance of 
speed in administering plasma.”

“I know of many traumatic 
shock casus where if plasma is ad­
ministered within 45 minutes a 
life is saved. An hour would be 
too late,” he pointed out. Lt. 
Fisher has seen extensive combat 
service in the Mediterranean 
theater and wears the Purple 
Heart for a wound received in 
combat

As many as 10 pints have been 
required to save the life of one 
man, according to Lt. Fisher..

“Cases using two and three 
pints are not at all uncommon,” 
he explained. "As a matter of 
fact, because of this* new pack­
ages are being made up with full 
quarts of plasma rather than pints 
because a pint is so seldom enough 
to do the job.”

LT. T. E. BONNET 
NOW CAPTAIN

L t T. E. Bonnet of Tulsa, Okla., 
has been promoted to the rank of 
captain at the Army Air Forces 
Tactical Center. This airbase is a 
combination of aerial college and 
demonstration course and it is 
here that new combat tactics are 
devised and countermeasures are 
developed against new enemy 
tactics.

Capt. Bonnet is assistant chief 
of the special services division at 
the Orlando, Florida base and di­
rects AFTAC’s War Information 
Center, which supplies military 
personnel with news and other 
material on current events. The 
WIC shows war films and ar­
ranges lectures by military per­
sonnel recently returned from 
overseas to relate their experience

Simple Ttif Aids 
Thousands Who Aro 

Hard of Hearing

Every 17monds (day and night)

A* ___. ■ ?__r is junked

the opportunity

pressures. ; .  inspecting for 
nail holes, cuts, and bruises . . .  
examining tires so that he can 
warn you when re-capping is 
imperative.

At the same time, he will inspect 
the battery, air filter, and cooling

THE DANGER LEVEL in number 
of automobiles in use is rapidly ap­
proaching. Out of 30,000,000 cars, 
6,000,000 or otu in every five have 
already disappeared from the high­
ways. And of those remaining, more 
than 5,000 every day go to the 
scrap heap!

Says the Office of Defense Trans­
portation: "Private automobiles 
must perform three-fourths of the 
essential local wartime transporta­
tion service, . .  Street cars, buses, 
and rapid transit lines can haul only 
a small share, approximately 25 per 
cent of the essential load.

So Care For Your Car For Your 
Country by enlisting the aid of your 
Phillips 66 Service Man. He is ready 
and waiting to help you.

At least once a week, give him 
of cheating air

system. And at regular intervals be 
sure to have him lubricate every 
friction point specified by the maker 
of your car...and make either the 
seasonal or the recommended every- j 
sixty-day oil change.

Every Phillips 66 Service Man 
shares with you the responsibility 
of guarding that part of America’s 
mileage which remains 
and tires. So gee Phillips 
and Tire-Saving Service at any 
Phillips 66 Shield . . .  the sign of 
famous Phillips 66 Gasoline and 
Phillips 66 Motor Oil.

FOR VICTORY... Buy U. S. War Bonds and Stamps
to AFTAC personnel 

A graduate of Bartlesville, 
Oklahoma High School and a for­
mer student at the University of 
Tulsa, Capt. Bonnet was employed 
by the Beneficial Management 
Corp., before entering the service. 
His mother, Mrs. T. D. Bonnet 
now lives in Clarendon.

Douglas k Goldston Drug Co.

OP A CONSUMER 
NOTES

The basis for a nation-wide re­
duction of consumer prices on 
cooked corned beef expected to 
be at least 10 cents a pound and 
greater in some instances—was 
set by issuance of OPA specific 
dollar-and-cents ceilings for this 
product at the wholesale level.

Primost cheese prices at all 
levels of distribution will be three 
cents a pound higher after this 
week as a result of OPA action to 
relieve hardship suffered by man­

ufacturers under the previous 
price ceiling.

Ceiling prices of plug chewing 
tobacco have been increased by 20 
per cent at all sales levels as a 
step to help manufacturers over­
come the increased cost burden 
under which they operate.

TEXAS HOLDS FIRST POSITION 
AMONG BIG QUOTA STATES

Texas again held first position 
among all big quota states in the 
nation and moved up from sixth 
to fourth place among all states 
in the most recent weekly report 
of National War Fund collections, 
Wayland D. Towner, general 
manager of the United War Chest 
of Texas, announced Saturday.

The state standings are based 
upon the percentage of each 
state’s war fund goal reached. 
Texas has led all big quotta states 
since the annual campaign open­

ed on Oct. 10, and has steadily 
moved up in the “all states” list, 
Towner said.

On October 28, the date of the 
last report compiled by the Na­
tional War Fund, Texans had con­
tributed 87.05 per cent of the state 
goal of approximately $5,000,000. 
Towner announced.

Donley County Leader, $2 a year.

Dr. Keith S. Lowell
GENERAL PRACTICE 

AND SURGERY

Offices in Goldston Bldg. 
Office Phone 128 

Residence Phone 174

WE HAVE
COTTON SEED MEAL 

AND SOY BEAN MEAL

Clarendon Gin
C . S. SE W A R D . M a n a g a r

. . . o r  keeping up the good work
Faster and faster the ships go dow n the ways in the wartime shipbuilding 
program . From sunny California to  the coast of M aine, w orkers have learned 
that the pause (but refreshes helps everybody do  more w ork and better w ork. 
Have a “Cakef' says a hard-w orking shipbuilder to  his mates. I t’s a little minute 
long enough for a big rest. W hether in a shipyard o r in  your own living room , 
Coca-Cola stands for the pause that refreshes,—has become a symbol o f friendly 
relaxation.

lO t t l lO  UM DII AUTHOtITV OP THt COCA-COIA COMPANY SY

MEMPHIS C O C A - C O L A  BOTTLING COMPANY

“ C o k e ”  s  C oca-C ola
It’s natural for popular names 
to  acquire friendly abbrevia- 

l tiont. That’* why you hear 
I Coca-Cola called “Coke”.

mmO IMA TW C-C C w .


