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Muleshoe
The L . buddie Volunteer 

Fire Department will spon­
sor a Trap Shoot on Sat­
urday, December 3 from 1 
p.m. until sundow/ . The 
shoot will be locates jehind 
the Sherley-Anderson Eleva­
tor at Lazbuddie. There will 
be a jackpot prize for the 
winner.

*****
ASCS ballots for the elec­

tion/nomination for Commu­
nity Committeemen must be 
returned to the Bailey 
County ASCS office by Dec­
ember 5 in order to be 
countt J.

*****

December 1 & 2, Ralls 
merchants and Security 
State Bank and Trust Com­
pany will open their doors 
for their second annual open 
house. Refreshments will be 
served and door prizes given 
from 10:00 to 5:30. Womens 
Division of the Ralls Cham­
ber of Commerce and Ag. 
will assist in hostess duties. 

*****
A series of prepared child 

birth classes will begin in 
December for Mulehoe resi­
dents. Gasses will be held 
on Mondays from 7:30 p.m. 
until 9 p.m. If interested 
and baby is due in Jan., 
Feb., or March, call Kern 
Berry at AC 505-359-1403 in 
Portales or Cindy Willis at 
AC 505-784-5839 in Govis 
for more information.

*••••
The Muleshoe Square 

Dance Club plans to begin 
lessons on January 12, 1984 
At the American Legion 
Hall. Lessons consist of 20 
lessons, each Thursday 
night at 7 p.m. The first two 
lessons are complimentary. 
For more information call 
272-3659, 946-3622 or 
925-6656.

•**••
The Lamb County Sher­

iffs Posse of Littlefield is 
having a membership drive 
and urges all horseback rid­
ers in Muleshoe and the 
surrounding area to join 
them for horse laik and re­
freshments on December 1 
at 7 p.m. at the Lamb 
County Electric Building on 
the South Loop in Littlefield. 

•*•••
The Muleshoe FFA now 

has fruit and sausage for 
sale. To order yours, contact 
any FFA member or call the 
Ag Department at 272-3456 
during school hours.

••••*
Due ot popular request, 

the Lazbuddie Young Home­
makers have re-ordered a 
limited number of the Laz­
buddie Community cook­
books. There are still a few 
available, and you may re­
serve your copy by calling 
Cindy Cargile at 965-2417, 
Lana Copp at 965-2806 or 
Reta Mimms at 265-3470.
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County 4-H’ers Honored At 
District Gold Star Banquet

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Muleshoe Stores Set 
Late Shopping Hpurs

GOLD STAR WINNERS.. .Zanna Huckabiy, daughter erf Mr. and Mrs. Lyndon Huckaby and 
Shelley Sain, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Walter Sain of Muleshoe we;v recently honored at the 
District Gold Star Banquet held in Lubbock. Speaker for the occasion was Senator Bill 
Sarpalius. The two young ladies were named for this honor due to their outstanding 
accomplishments in different 4-H projects.

Moisture Lost From Rains 
Due To Soil Compaction

The positive side to all the 
late, untimely ..'.in on the 
Southern High Plains is its 
potential for increasing deep 
soil moisture, UNLESS the 
field has a hardpan. A pan 
not only slows water’s in­
filtration rate, it can create 
an effective barrier to deep 
penetration, according to 
the High Plains Under­
ground Water Conservation 
District #1.

That moisture also has the 
potential to contribute to 
even tougher hardpans for 
the farmer in a hurry to get 
back into the field to 
harvest. Trips through a wet 
field are probably the major

HONORED...Thurman Cole­
man, Muleshoe tackle, was 
recently named by 
KMAC-TV in Lubbock as 
“ All-South Plains Defensive 
Tackle” in a choice by that 
station. Coaches' picks for 
all-district and all-state have 
not yet been revealed.

cause of severe soil com­
paction. Even when the 
ground appears dry near the 
surface, hidden moisture 
may be optimum for causing 
compaction at 8 or 9 inches.

The High Plains lost many1 
inches of rain to runoff last 
year because of frequent, 
high intensity spring rains. 
Readings in June of 1982 .fey 
Water District staff in a 
network of moisture mon- 
itering sites over the area 
showed 60 io 80 percent of 
those rains never made it 
into the soil root profile. 
Runoff, aggravated by 
hardpans, was the common 
cause.

To prevent those moisture 
losses again next spring and 
to ensure a good soil 
moisture reservoir, check for 
hardpans before the next 
rains. Farmers may find 
their soil is storing less of 
this fall’s rains than they 
thought. Start by checking 
the plant root zone at the 
two, three and four foot 
depth with an auger.

Using a simple feel meth­
od, if the soil will ball up 
tightly in the hand, it is 
close to 75% of field 
capacity. If it clings but 
won’t hold a good lump, you 
are probably at 50 percent of 
field capacity or less. But if 
the compressed soil falls 
apart in the hand, it still 
needs a heavy dose of soil 
moisture to fill your root 
zone for next season’s crop.

The most evident sym­
ptom of a compact soil is a 
shallow root system, 
growing horizontally. It is

especially noticeable in a tap 
rooted crop such as cotton. 
The only way to see a hard- 
pan is to dig a hole at least 
three feet deep and look for 
crop roots in the subsoil. If 
they have penetrated that 
deep, chances are the next 
crop will also penetrate that 
deep, unless the land is 
subjected to excessive till­
age or macninery traffic 
before planting.

Another check is to push a 
sharp, steel, small diameter 
rod into the soil at a slow 
uniform ptessure. The force 
required should be constant 
unless you hit a pan.

It is nearly impossible to 
prevent some soil com­
paction, but you can confine 
it to the same rows year 
after year. Don’t move over 
half a row each spring. 
Create permanent track 
paths by marking and 
always using the same 
traffic lane. This will pre­
vent your planting crop over 

Con’t Page 6, Col. 4

With the Christmas shop­
ping season now in Mil 
swing, the Muleshoe Cham- 
be of Commerce and Agri­
culture is encouraging resi­
dents of the Muleshoe area 
to do their shopping at home 
this year. Clerks in member 
retail stores are being en­
couraged to wear ribbons 
•vhich wish their customers 
"Seasons Greetings” , and 
also thanking them for 
shopping in Muleshoe.

While there are some 
items which may not be 
available locally, local citi­
zens are being asked to give 
Muleshoe merchants an 
opportunity to serve them. 
Recently a member of the 
Chamber’s Board of Direc­
tors conducted a price co n- 
parison on several items 
between Clovis, Lubbock 
and Muleshoe. Muleshoe 
merchants were found to be 
offering lower prices on ail 
of the items compared with 
both Govis and Lubbock.

“ While it would be un­
realistic to expect everyone 
to buy everything in Mule­
shoe, we do hope that 

, people in our area will shop 
"" Muleshoe first,” said Cham­

ber President Robert Mont­
gomery. "This means that 
we hope that you will give 
local merchants the first 
opportunity to provide your 
Christmas shopping needs.” 

Several members of the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture met 
in a special planning session 
on Tuesday, November 22 to 
discuss retail promotions. 
Members decided that 
stores would be encouraged 
to stay open late on Thurs­
day evenings between 
Thanksgiving and Christ­
mas.

Member stores will also

be registering shoppers for 
a drawing for an intellivision 
Home video game. How­
ever, registration will only 
take place after 6:00 p.m. on 
Thursdays to help encour­
age late shoppers. No uni­
form closing time was set 
for the late Thursday sche ­
dule to allow individual 
businesses some flexibility.

It was also strongly re­
commended that businesses 
run a “ Late Hours Special” 
on at least one item and 
advertise it to help make the 
late hours shopping a suc­
cess.

Chamber members at the 
meeting also decided to plan 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 1

Thirty-nine outstanding 
tnerr ers of 4-H Clubs 
across the South Plains were 
honored in Lubbock Monday 
night, Nov. 21.

In addition to receiving 
the Gold .' far Award, high­
est honor presented at the 
county level, the youths 
were urged by State Sen. 
Bill Sarpalius to dream 
dreams of acheivement and 
then set about making those 
dreams reality.

Joining the youths at the 
awards banquet in the cafe­
teria at Coronado High 
School were parents, gov­
ernment crrficials, Extension 
leaders, fellow 4-H’ers, ed­
ucators and other commu­
nity leaders.

Honored from Bailey 
County were Shelly Sain; 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Sain, of Muleshoe, 
and Zanna Huckaby, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Lyndon 
Huckaby of Muleshoe.

“ We live in a ereat 
coumr We have more to

Local Farm Dealer Will 
Sponsor NFR Telecast

Reynolds & Young, Inc. of 
Muleshoe will join Hesston 
Corporation and more than 
1,000 other participating 
Hesston Farm Equipment 
dealers across North Amer­
ica in sponsoring the tele­
cast of the 1983 National 
Finals Rodeo from Okla­
homa City.

The program will air 
locally on KCBD (Channel 
11), Lubbock, Sunday, Dec­
ember 11, 8-10 MST.

The two-hour, prime-time 
special will feature
same-day coverage of the 
final championship perfor­
mance of the 1983 NFR, on 
a live tape delay.

1983 marks the 25th anni­
versary year of the NFR and 
the tenth consecutive year 
that Hesston Corporation 
has sponsored the telecast.

The telecast will open 
with a 30-minute “ Count­
down to Glory,” highlight

tng early action from the 
week-long finals and featu­
ring segments from the first 
NFR in 1959. There will also 
be interviews with champ­
ions from the 1959 NFR. 
The “ Countdown" will be 
immediately followed by 
90-minute coverate of the 
tenth and final champion­
ship performance. Most of 
ProRodeo’s world champion­
ships, including the 
Con’t Page 6, Col. 2

be thankful for .hen anyone 
else in the w Id. Yet we 
take so much fo: granted,”

Sarpalius said.
The state senator said he 

was concerned about the 
decline in American family 
life as evidenced by an in­
creasing divorce rate, our 
lack of support for our 
churches, an increasing 
crime rate and other prob­
lems. But he said we are 
fortunate to have organiza­
tions such as 4-H Clubs, 
celebrating heir 75th anni­
versary this year, to g: e 
yourngsters the opportunity 
to learn by doing and deve­
lop leadership skills.

He told of hearing former 
President Lyndon B. John­
son tell a group of youths 
visiting Washington to 
dream dreams and then 
make those dreams come 
true. “ I realized that was 
the purpose of America,” 
Sarpalius said, to provide a 
place where that can 
happen.

Master of ceremonies was 
Dr. Kary Mathis, chairman 
of the department of agri­
cultural economics at Texas 
Tech University. Guests 
were welcomed by James 
Hull, General Manager of 
the Deaf Smith Electric coo- 
-erative, one of 12 electric 
cooperatives which have 
sponsored the banquet for 
the past 26 years. The 
others are Bailey County, 
Caprodw Dickens, Lamb, 
Lea, Lighthouse, Lone Wolf, 
Lyntegar, Midwest, South 
Plains, and Swisher cooper­
atives.

Con’t Page 6, Col. 2

Muleshoe FFA Boosters 
Elect New President

Check Of County Records 
Prove Crime On Increase

Colton Producers Protest 
Blow To Economic Recovery

Weather-ravaged High 
Plains cotton producers are 
urgently protesting the lat­
est blow to their chances for 
economic recovery, this one 
from Agriculture Secretary 
John Block and company.

At issue is a recent 
“ notice” to county Agricul­
tural Stabilization and Con­
servation Service (ASCS) 
offices which reduces the 
1983 floor under farm pay­
ment yields from 90 percent 
of the yield for the previous 
year to 80 percent of the 
previous year’s yield in 
1984.

The change, note officials 
of Lubbock-based \  Plains 
Cotton Growers, Inc., will 
result in a significant loss of 
yields and potential defici­
ency payments on the High 
Plains where yields already 
are low after repeated crop 
disasters in recent years.

PCG President Tommy 
Fondren of Lorenzo, recog­
nizing that the Adminsitra- 
tion needs a high level of 
participation L, the 75 per­

cent voluntar acreage re­
duction program of 1984, 
stressed that point in a Nov­
ember 15 letter to Secretary 
Block. Current low yields, 
Fondren said, will make it 
even more difficult to get 
producer participation in a 
program already under 
widespread criticism.

Calling attention to the 
high cost of the 1983 pro­
gram, Fondren cautioned 
the Secretary that if early 
1984 USDA acreage esti­
mates indicate a potential 
for rebuilding a large sur­
plus, “ ...this Administra­
tion, Congress, USDA and 
producers will feel the dis­
pleasure of the taxpayer.” 
And, he continued “ We 
feel this additional 10 per­
cent reduction in payment 
yields will encourage over­
production.”

Under current instructions 
county ASCS offices will use 
actual farm yields for the 
previous five years, 1979 
through 1983, to figure 1984 
payment yie’4s. If the

county committee deter­
mines that the yield in the 
lowest of the five years was 
the result of a disaster, that 
year will be dropped and an
Con’t Page 6, Col. 3

Blood Drive Set 
Here December 7

According to information 
from the United Blood Ser­
vices blood is always needed 
- but especially during the 
Holiday Season because of 
the accident rate.

A city wide blood drive 
being held in the fellowship 
hall at the First United 
Methodist Church of Mule­
shoe on December 7, 1983.

Bailey Coun.y used 70 
pints of blood last year and 
only 30 pints of blood were 
replaced by donations (on 
the average).

Anyone who is of the age 
17 through 65 years and are 
well are able to donate.
Corn Page 6, Col. 5

Law enforcement officials 
had a relatively quiet 
Thanksgiving Holiday in 
Muleshoe. Prior to that date 
howeve*\ several warrants 
were issued on bad check 
cases and failure to appear.

Bailey County Sheriff Bob 
Henderson reported to the 
Journal that during the 
eighteen years in Bailey 
County a total of 1495 pri­
soners were booked into the 
county jail. These accounts 
run from July 5, 1926 to 
October 27, 1944 and would 
show an average of approxi­
mately 83 prisoners per 
year.

For the years of 1981, 82 
and 83 to November 25, 
1295 prisoners were booked 
into the county jail, showing 
a substantial increase of 
431.6 prisoners per year. 
This was just in three year’s 
time. This just goes to show 
you that crime is truly on 
the increase..

Prisoners booked into the 
Bailey County Jail over the 
past w< ek include Jose Luis 
Delao on November 16 on a 
charge of alleged criminal 
mischief. He was released 
after posting a $500 prop­
erty bond. On November 17, 
Rene Sandoval was arrested 
on a failure to appear warr­
ant. He laid out his fine in 
jail. Also on the 17th Harry 
Sandoval was arrested on a 
failure to appear warrant 
and he also laid out his fine 
in jail. On November 18, 
John Casey Stewart was 
arrested on charges of all­
eged issuance of bad 
checks. He was released

after paying a fine.
Jesse Camarillo was 

arrested on November 19 on 
charges of failure to appear. 
He was released after pay­
ing a fine. On November 20, 
Jesus Garcia Triana was 
arrested on charges of alle­
ged DWI. He was released 
after posting a $500 cash 
bond.

Reports from the City 
Police were a little more 
numerous, but went back 
further in dates. On Novem­
ber 21, officers received a 
report of alleged harrass- 
ment from Elma Watkins.

Lazbuddie FFA 
Stays Busy

The Lazbuddie FFA Chap­
ter recently competed in 
Leader~hip Contests at Tech 
with a quiz team, comprised 
of Shane Mason, Dustin 
Jesko, Louis Cantrell and 
Robert Tapia. Frank Jesko 
also recently attended the 
FFA National Convention 
held at Kansas City.

On November 19, mem­
bers of the Lazbuddie FFA 
entered and showed stock in 
the Lamb Futurity at Semi­
nole, Texas. Sheldon Mason 
placed fourth with a Hamp­
shire, Shane Mason placed 
6th with a fine wool and 9th 
with a cross; while Sean 
Mason placed 7th with a 
Suffolk.

Plans are underway at 
this time for the District 
FFA Banquet scheduled for 
December 12 at South Plains 
College.

Also on the 21st, a legally 
parked vehicle belonging to 
Irma Ramos was hit by an 
Con’t Page 6, Col. 1

The Muleshoe FFA Boos­
ters met for a regular meet­
ing on Monday, November 
21 in the Ag department at 
high school.

Due to a conflict in sched­
ules, recently elected Presi­
dent Meryln Neel asked that 
a new president be elected. 
Gayland Black was elected 
to the office of president for 
the 1983-84 year.

Further business was dis­
cussed regarding the agri­
culture barn fence and the 
balance due to clear this 
project. Donors to this pro­
ject will have their names 
permanently posted on a 
sign at the barn area.

There was also discussion

of livestock show committ­
ees for sheep, swine and 
These committees will be 
responsible for helping ag 
students and FFA members 
keep up-to-date on the best 
in feeds and show proce­
dures.

The wrestling matches re­
cently sponsored by the FFA 
Boosters was successful and 
will probably be used again 
as a fund raiser for the 
group.

The next meeting of the 
boosters is scheduled on 
Monday, December 19 in 
the ag department at 8 p.m. 
All members, parents and 
other interested persons are

Con’t Page 6, Col. 3

MULESHOE'S CHRISTMAS DECOR...Employees of the Southwestern Publi Service 
Company and Bailey County Electric helped to get Muleshoe’s Christmas decorations up just 
prior to the Thanksgivii.g Holidays on Main street and at the Mule Lot. The dr after 
Tha ..........................................anksgiving is traditionally known as one of the biggest shopping days of the year.



Accurate Tax Records 
Necessary for Taxpayers

Keeping accurate finan- -take, the Internal Revenue 
cial records is probably one Service advises, 
of the best tax saving When the time comes for 
actions that a taxpayer can filing a federal tax return,

good records can mean the 
difference between filing an 
accurate return or an inac­
curate one, the Internal Re­
venue Service says. Also, 
good records can help tax­
payers take all the deduc­
tions and benefits to which 
they are entitled.

Taxpayers are not requir­
ed to use a specific record­
keeping system. However, 
receipts, cancelled checks, 
bills, old returns, and other 
written documents are es­
sential in proving expenses. 
Tax records should be kept 
at least three years after the 
return is due or filed, or two 
years after the tax was paid, 
whichever is later.

An exception to the three 
year retention rule is a prop­
erty transaction, su b is the 
purchase of real estate, 
"bese records -hould be 
xept for as ic ? as they are 
helpful in determining the 
basis of original or replace­
ment property.

More detailed information 
about recordkeeping a- 
ppears in the free IRS Publi­
cation 552, “ Recordkeeping 
Reqr:rements and a List of 
Tax Publications.” Taxpay­
ers can obtain the free pub- 
i lication by mail by using the 
handy order blank contained 
in the tax package

13ff  Ujjers 
Training Option 
On Job Skills

The Mechanical Electrical! 
Technology program at 
TSTI-Amarillo offers a train­
ing option for students who 
want to receive marketable 
job skills in a short time. 
The Commercial Building 
Maintenance option allows 
full-time students to receive 
a Commercial Building 
Maintenance Technician 
certificate in one year. 
Part-time, evening classes 
will also be available bei, li­
ning with winter quarter 
classes.

The Commercial Building 
Maintenance option trains 
students to work in apart­
ment complexes, office 
buildings, hotels and 
motels, and other commer­
cial facilities as maintenance 
technicians. Electrical sys­
tems, welding, air condition­
ing and refrigeration, heat­
ing systems, construction, 
plumbing am preventative 
maintenance are covered in 
this option.

Registra^n for all TSTI 
Winter Qu«.ier classes will 
be Tuesday, November 29 
from 8:30 a.m. to 7:30 p.m.

1. What is the nautical 
unit of speed?
2. Do typhoons always 
spin in the same di­
rection?
3. What is the 16th 
Amendment?
4. What is the shape of an 
obelish?
5. When v&x the first 
American f eg,on con­
vention held?
Answers to Who Knows

/ The knot.
L. No; they spin clockwise 
of the Equator, and 
counter-clockwise north of 
it.
3. The Federal Income 
Tax law.
4. Pointed pillar.
5. November 8. 1919.

COTTON BOARD ELECTS NEW OFFICERS...Recently elected to one year terms on the 
Cotton Board are (from left): Caleb Davis, III, Braggadocia, Mo., Secreatry; Glen Stevens, 
Fresno, C ., Chairman; Ben Bowden, Eufaula, Al., Treasurer; and Tommy Funk, Harlingen, 
Tx., Vice i.:,airman. The Cotton Board is responsible for administering cotton’s research and 
promotion programs and activities, funded by producer dollars and conducted by Cotton 
Incorporated.

Older Americans Feel Vulnerable
Many older Americans 

feel move vulnerable to 
crime because of physical 
limitation: and limited fin­
ancial resources, says Judith 
Wan n, a family life educa- 
tior aging specialist.

’ Actually, older people 
are not victimized any more 
or less than other age 
groups but this fact does not 
help feelings of fear,” says 
Warren, who is with the 
Texas A&M University 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice home economics pro­
gram.

“ Older persons vi both 
cities and small towns some­
times end up living in high 
crime areas,” Warren says. 
Though they may have lived 
in the same place for years, 
the neighborhood often 
changes around them. They 
are the outsider -- the diff­
erent person -  and so might 
be victimized.

“ Older people living in 
rural areas may feel the 
isolation more than they did 
when they were younger,” 
she aads.

Crime prevention organi­
zations have a series of sug­
gestions for older persons.

To prevent robbery, make 
sure the home is locked 
whenever you are net home.

Older persons can do 
some things themselves, 
too, says Warren. Women 
do not have to carry their 
purses with them all the 
time. If they are out for a 
walk or windowshopping, 
they can leave their purse at 
home and remove some 
temptation to a purse 
snatcher.

“ Go out with friends,” 
says the specialist. “ There 
is security in numbers. Plan 
vour route so that you are 
traveling in safe areas and 
don’t always go to the same 
place at the same time. Go
grocery shopping at diffe­
rent times so that an intru 
der can’t learn your sche­
dule.”

Dead bolt locks, locks or 
pins in windows and c‘"sed 
garage doors help keep a 
home secure.

The appearance of some­
one in the home is important 
too. Lights left on or a radio 
played at normal volume can 
be a deterrant.

Many neighborhoods or­
ganize a Neighborhood 
Watch. In this, neighbors 
agree to be aware of each 
other’s home and report to 
the police any activities out 
of the ordinary.

Even a casual neigh- 
bor-to-neighbor conversa­
tion asking that the home be 
watched, can give the older 
person a feeling of security, 
notes the home economist.

“  onle Rack Shirts *3 - ;5 

All Shorts s2°° off Mule Socks, too!!

Place Orders For Painted or Lace-Trimmed Sweat 

Shirts for Christmas

Ann's T-Shirts Unlimited
124 E. Avc a Lay-Awoy NOW!!! 272-5633

a
 Dial (806) 2f?-4?96

DENT•REMPE
Sales Service 

Muleshoe, Texas

Nothing Drives Like A "Deere"

New 484 Strippers 
New 283 Strippers 
Used ’80 484 Strippers 
Used ’79 484 Strippers

Used ’79 JD 8820 Combine
AFB Plans *2.9 Million Construction

During the next 12 units will be receiving new
months. Cannon AFB hous- roofs; floor tiles will be re-
ing will undergo construe- placed in units as required;
tion projects amounting to and drives, walks and
$2.9 million. streets will be repaired and

The 19 projects will give resurfaced as needed.” 
base housing a major face “ Gemeni housing will be 
lift through the work pre- receiving new roofs^and new 
sently being done and those ©IkWrlOr electric distribution, 
starting in the near future. Some units will have shower

Col. Mary N. Turner, 27th tiles replaced to stop leak- 
Combat Support Group com- a8e- the colonel added, 
mander said, "There are Mercury housing will re­
several projects that affect ceive the majority of the
units in all housing areas. work. Some units will re-
We’U be painting most ex- ceive new front and rear
teriors as ;well as adding ^entrances, and nejK interior 
brick work to many units; water lines. Additionally,
fences, both brick and wood- new roofs will be put on
en, will be repaired; some ’“■•several units.

with 645 corn head

Used 21 ’ Krause Wing fold disk

r -Used JD.60£ Rotary Cutter 80C
Used JD 2280 Windrower 19,500.0(
W/JD230 auger platform & #30 hay condt.

H O O V E R  SPIRITConcept
One
• Power Drive™
• Quedreflex™ Agitation
• One-Speed Motor
• Cord Wrap
• Quick ft Clean 

Bag Change
• Self Adjusting 

Nozzle
• Dual Handle Release
• Brushed Edge Cleaning

1U/2'' doll dressed in pink. Com 
plete with chair and ac 
cessories. Ages 3 and up.

7’/4Qt.
Disposable
bag
Check-bag
signal
24000 RPM 
Oual/Stage 
Motor/Fan 
system /

Big 4-inch
canister
wheels 2 to 4 players. For ages 4 to
Handy
topside
switch
Dual-edge
cleaning

Sale Starts 

Friday, November 25 Mickey, Pluto, GoofyDonald
and Dumbo pop up when lids 
are unlocked by 5 different ac­
tivities. Ages 1 to 3’/a yrs.

2-MOTOR
CONVERTIBLE

UPRIGHT HOOVER. SPIRIT
Powernozzle-Canister 
System
• 'Quadraflex' agitation
• Edge brusher plus 

dual edge suction
• 7’A qt. disposable bag
• Check bag signal
• 24000 RPM Dual/Stage 

motor-fan system
• Sound deadening 

muffler
• Handy topside switchJ

U4127 Tool Set
10 Piece 
Plastic Tool box 
No 423

All Steel Agitator 

Big Disposable Bag

Floor Carpet Shift
S3211

Regular $249.95

NATIONALLY FA M O U S FULL FEATURE 
52 BRA SS REVERSIBLE

•  REVERSIBLE FOR WINTER •  SILENT BALL BEARING MOTOR
• 3-SPEED PUU CHAIN • UL-USTED, 5 VR WARRANTY
• 8T  SOLID WOOD BLADES • CHOOSE FROM BRASS FINISHES

OFFICIAL COMPETITION 
PULL SET™ f T T h

Your Authorized

Hoover Dealer

Set comes with a fully-assembled Pulling System. 
Includes counterbalance mechanisms, sled, weight 
box & 2 pylons.
For 4 years & up.
No. 803 O Q Q

2724511

SHOP EARLY & SAVE .. WHILE SUPPLIES LAST!

“ ■ OPTIONAL 
4 a s uokt icmAkin Al AM 4
•  ROUND GLOBE

(KOBE 7
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Elementary PTA Announces 

Membership Drive Winners
The Muleshoe Elementary 

P.T.A. met in regular 
session on Monday Nov. 21, 
at 7:00 p.m. in the Mary 
DeShazo cafeteria.

The meeting was called to 
order by Jean Richardson, 
president. The invocation 
was given by John Boo 
Pledge of Alliegence was leu 
by Jean Richardson. Treasu­
rers report was given by 
Rh^nJa Htigg.

It ws* reported that the 
Halloween carnival this year 
was very successful. There 
was a very large attendance 
and the carnival profits were 
greater than past years.

The P.T.A. members pre­
sent at the meeting unani­
mously voted to help the 
Mary DeShazo school with a 
balloon pen pal campaign in 
March. All the students will 
release helium filled ball­
oons with notes attached. 
The notes will be asking the 
tinder of the balloon to be­
come a pen pal.

Winners of the 1983-84 
membership drive contest 
were announced as follows: 
Mary DeShazo Elementary, 
First Place - Mrs. Bobbie 
Johnson - $25.00 and Sec­
ond place - Mrs. Wilma 
Smith - $15.00. Dillman Ele­
mentary, First Place - Mrs. 
Jan Morris - $25.00 and 
Second Place - Mrs. Pat 
Brewer - $15.00.

The contest prizes went to 
the room with the largest 
number of memberships 
after September. The cash 
prizes are to be used for 
supplies for the teacher’s 
room.

Announcements were 
made as follows:

The April meeting will be 
changed to April 23, 1984.

Rebekah Lodge 

Meeting Held 

Tuesday
Muleshoe Rebekah Lodge 

#114 was called to order by 
Noble Grand Mildred 
Neeley. They had 15 mem­
bers in attendance. Patsy 
Chance, Nita Griffiths and 
Juanita Busby presented the 
flag and Sandi Robinson 
gave the opening prayer.

Roll was called and the 
minutes of the previous 
meeting were read and 
approved.

A letter was read form 
Girls Town asking for their 
Christmas Donation. A do­
nation of $10.00 was sent. It 
was also noted that the Girls 
Town has a need for a 
couple to be house parents. 
The job requirements are 
that you have a overload of 
patience and mountains of 
love.

Nominations for Noble 
Grand were Dorothy Chance 
and Dimple Sims. Nomina­
tion for Vice Grand was 
Sandi Robinson. Nomina­
tions for Secretary were 
Fern Davis and Thursie 
Reid. Nominations for Fin­
ancial Secretary were Joye- 
lene Costen and Adele 
Tompkins. Nomination for 
Team Captain was Ruby 
Green. Nomination for Re­
presentative was Francis 
Steven. Nomination for Al­
ternate was Adele Tomp­
kins.

The nominations will be 
open again next week for 
these offices. The elections 
will be held the following 
week.

Ten members of the 
Muleshoe Lodge attended 
the District Meeting held in 
Friona on Monday evening. 
A meal was served by the 
group. The Muleshoe Lodge 
presented the program. 
Four members attended 
from the Hereford Lodge 
and the Friona lodge was 
represented by 13 members, 
fhe Din mitt lodge was un­
able to attend.

A short school of instruc­
tions was held by ?.uby 
Green, Lodge Deputy.

Refreshments were serv­
ed by Greta McCormick, 
Lena Hawkins and Jessie 
Robinson.
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The next P.T.A. meeting 
will be held on January 16, 
program for the night will 
be centered aroung Drug 
Awareness, parents and 
children are urged to attend.

John Fuller, superinten­
dent of schools, was intro­
duced to the members pre­
sent. Fuller spoke on the 
current issues in education. 
He included f :cts on House 
Bill 246 (which h, now law). 
This is a new cr Ticulum bill 
that will mandate the teach 
ing of defined .items to all 
students. Wc must teach the 
minumums. There will be a 
2 year implementation pla- 
for this bill.

Fuller also pointed out 
some of uie good things that 
are happening in the.Mule- 
shoe schools.

1. Membership is up com­
pared to the estimates

2. T he 65 or Over club has 
200+ members

3. The 5th Saturday - talk 
with the superintendent 
program is off to a success­
ful start.

4. The Computer Literacv 
Committee has been tra­
veling to area schools to 
study computer instruction. 
They are developing a dis­
trict wid~ plan for use of 
computers.

5. The reonvation pro­
gram for Muleshoe I.S.D. is 
progressing in small steps. 
Currently the school is 
accepting bids for an all 
purpose building at Dillman 

.Elementary.
Following Mr. Fuller’s 

talk, members present en­
joyed a new fangled cake 
walk. There were approxi­
mately 2C cakes given away 
to those present.

Meeting was adjourned 
by Jean Richardson.

* * * *
Many tales start with: 

"Well, they tell me...”

(jW/t oAAas Qamme/t OeMiftate 50tl» (^imiiG/tea/ty

1983 CHRl'TMAS HOME TOUR. Xi Omicron Xi’s Christ­
mas Home T»>ur is scheduled Sunday, Dec. 4 from 1 to 4 p.m. 
Tickets are $3.00 each and may be purchased from any Xi 
Omicron Xi member or at the door of the first home on the 
tour, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Liles home (back cf the Country 
Club.) For additional information or tickets, you may call 
272-3180. M'«. Bob Finney is showing a special attraction in 
her home, where the tour will end and refreshments will be 
served. A door prize will also be given at 4 p.m.

Miss Charm Pageant Seeking Girls

8

Classified
Advertising

Brings
Great Results 

Call 272-4536

America’s Miss Charm 
National Scholarship Page­
ant is looking f jr girls to 
represent this state at the 
upcoming National Finals, 
July 10-14th, in Washing­
ton, D.C. There are 5 age 
divisions and a representa­
tive is geing sought for each 
age category. Little Miss 
(4-6), Miss Idea! (7-9), Jun­
ior Miss (10-12), Teen 
13-i6), and Miss (17-25).
ach girl will compete in a 

private interview, talent, 
evening gown and sports­
wear. Over $50,000 in Scho- 
larshipV Prizes and Awards 
will be presented through­
out the finals.

Each representative will 
be officially crowned and 
presented a trophy for her 
participation. She will also 
be given a Special Grooming 
Seminar where she will be 
informed on General Etiqu­
ette, social graces, the pro­
per way to walk, sit, turn on 
stage to help build self-ccn- 
fidence and self-esteem.

As a Youth Development 
Program in its 7th year, it 
enocurages community and 
state participation through 
civic and social organiza­
tions by giving of their time 
and talents to charitable

functions. America’s Miss 
Charm National Finals arc 
presented to award scholar­
ships and to bring outstand­
ing recognition to all partici­
pants.

America’s Miss Charm 
National Headquarters
would like to invite girls 
from this stare, regardless 
of race, color or creed to 
apply. Send a long, stamp­
ed, self-addressed envelope, 
stating your age, for more 
details to: AMERICA’S
MISS CHARM SCHOLAR­
SHIP PROGRAM 
P.O. Box 7246, Jacksonville, 
N.C. 28540. (919)455-9643.

Acquisition 
Some men ate born 

with a will of their own. 
Others marry one.

-Spotlight, San Diegv.

There are fifty thousand 
rooms, or cells, in the 
average honeybee hive.

Get Your Wedding Invitations 
.  Here.

Williams Bros Office Supply
322 Main 272-3113

> ir

idwrtism* row cart on opplrcota..

The Muleshoe PTA Would Like To 

Thank The Following Muleshoe Businesses 

and Supporters For Their Donations To Our Halloween 

Carnival. These Donations Make The Event Possible 

As Well As Successful.
A & M  Farm SupplyCorral 

Lookin' Good 

Bratcher Motor Supply 

Gulf Wholesale 

Blue Stamp Store 

Mohawk Auto Parts 

Spudnut Shop 

Buddy's Shoes 

Muleshoe Trade Center 

Anna's House of Beauty 

Harvey Bass 

Muleshoe Pawn 

Chubby's 

Honey Comb 

Duncan's Ceramic Shop 

Dent-Rempe 

Lee's Western Wear 

Lotrells
Reynolds & Young 

Sanitary Barber Shop 

Main Street Beauty Shop 

San Francisco Cafe 

Lambert Cleaners 

Sears 

Perry's 

Anthonys 

Decorator's Floral 

Lindseys Jewelry 

The Shear Shack

Carter Williams 

Ronald Scott

Sammy's Sporting Goods 

Williams Brothers Office Supply 

Damron Drug 

Albertson's 

Something Special 

Muleshoe Floral And Gifts 

The Fair Store 

Western Drug 

Ann's T-Shirts 

Adrian Photography 

Leal's Restaurant 

Weidebush & Co.

Fry & Cox 

Poynor's Whites 

Wilson Appliance 

Higganbotham's 

First National Bank 

Costume Judges 

James & Vanda Turnbow 

Fred & Charlena Lindt 

Wayne & Pam Aklin 

Booth Judges 

George & Diane Nieman 

Horton Griffin

Assistants

R.A Bradley Toni Eagle

Fred Lindt Sid Duncan

Ed Cox Kent Wiley

A surprise family getto- 
gether in celebration of the 
50th wedding anniversary of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Gammon 
was hosted by their child­
ren, Joe and Jean Briggs, 
Johnny and Mary Lou 
Gammon, Marianna Gam­
mon and their grandchildren 
on Saturday, Jet. 29 at th«* 
Briggs home in the Bovi 
area.

Family members a tten^d  
from Texas, Oklahoma, Ne«;, 

'Mexico, Tennessee and r. u- 
qox, Ariz. to join the week­
end celebration.

Festivities included a Sat­
urday nocn barbeque, an 
afternoon open nouse and 
visiting and sharing of mem­
ories. Quilt blocks made by 
family and friends were on 
display and prompted many
reminisciences.

A memory book was pre­
sented to the couple by 
Gammon’s sisters, Mrs. 
Irene Thorn and Mrs. Della 
Danile The book contained 
photos and best wishes from 
106 family and friends from 
the Lazbuddie and Mule­
shoe area.

A two-tiered wedding 
cake decorated with yellow 
roses was served during the 
open house by Malissa and 
Melinda Briggs of Aurora, 
Colo., the couple’s grand­
daughters. Punch was ser­
ved by a grandson, David 
Briggs.

Granddaughers, Marisa 
and Marela Gammon also 
helped with the festivities. 
Many gifts, flowers and 
cards were given the couple.

John Henry Gammon 
moved to Lazbuddie from 
Maud, Okla in 1929, to 
ranch and farm with his 
parents, Will and Savannah 
Gammon. Grace Jennings 
moved to Lazbuddie in 1930, 
to teach after graduating 
from Transylvania Univer­
sity in Kentucky. The couple 
met and were married on 
Oct. 29, 1933, the bride’s 
father, W.P. Jennings per­
formed the wedding cere­
mony at the Lubbock Christ­
ian Church.

The couple settled down 
to ranch in the Lazbuddie 
and Muleshoe areas until 
1964, when they moved to 
the Bovina area with a son, 
Johnny, a daughter, Mari­
anna and daughter and 
son-in-law, Joe and Jean 
Briggs and their two daugh­

ters.
Until recently, they have 

ranched, farmed and raised 
peaches and apples in the 
area. They now make their 
home in Wilcox. They both 
continue to reamin active in 
community and Church of 
Christ activities.

Out of town guests includ­
ed: Mrs. Della Daniel, Mrs.

Irene Thorn, Mr. and Mrs. 
J.W. Gammon, Mrs. Rick 
Blackand Seth, Mr. and 
Mrs. Everett McBroom, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Daniel of Laz­
buddie, Mr. and Mrs. Reece 
Wilterding of Tulia, Mrs. 
Pat Henry, and Gail Henry 
of Arlington, Mrs. Walter 
Hughes of Farwell, Mrs. 
Carrol Hunton of Portales,

N. M., Mr. and Mrs. Clar­
ence Raper of Konowa, 
Okla., Paul and Edna Gam­
mon of Seymour, Tenn., Mr. 
and Mrs. Loyd Vaughn of 
Dimmitt, Mr. and Mrs.
O. H. Ealkenstein of Laguna 
Hills, Calif., Louise Butts 
and Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Wagoner, Jamie and J.T. of
Tuscon, Ariz.

Chocolate Ribbon Cheesecake 
Fast And Festive For The Holidays

........... - - t i lN iilil lM .il  iihCelebrate the holidays this 
year with a gala open-house 
dessert buffet. For sipping, 
offer a choice of chilled white 
wine s  thick and creamy 
homemade eggnog, rich with 
ftesh eggi., milk and La Creme 
whipped topping. Spread the 
“sweet” table with do-ahead 
Christmas cookies, fruitcake 
fruit-nut quick breads and ...u 
spectacular Chocolate R ib '.. n 
Cheesecake pictured here.

A luscious blend of r«ady- 
to-use ingredients including 
choco la te  pieces, cream  
cheese, whipped topping and 
marshmallow cream — in a 
chocolate wafer crust — the 
cheesecake require? little prep­
aration time, can be made a 
day before the party. To 
make self-service easy, pre-slice 
rake on serving plate, being 
careful to wipe knife blade 
clean after each cut.

Chocolate Ribbon 
Cheesecake

2 cups chocolate wafer 
crumbs

cup Parkay margaine, 
melted 

* • • 
envelope unflavored 

gelatin
cup cold water 
8-oz. pkgs. Philadelphia 

Brand cream cheese, 
softened

1 teaspoon vanilla 
1 7-oz. jar Kraft marsh­

mallow creme 
1 8-oz. container (3 cups) 

La Creme whipped 
topping with real 
cream, thawed 

1 cup semi-sweet choco­
late pieces, melted 

Combine crumbs and mar­
garine; press onto bottom of 
9-inch springform pan. Chill.

Soften gelatin in water; 
stir over low heat until dis­
solved. Combine cream cheese
and vanilla, mixing until well 
blended. Gradually add gela­
tin, mixing until blended. 
Beat in marshmallow creme; 
fold in 2 cups whipped 
topping. Fold chocolate into 
2 cups gelatin mixture. Pour 
remaining gelatin mixture over 
crust; carefully spoon on 
chocolat* mixture. ChiU until 

'•firm. Top with remaining 
whipped topping.

1/2

1/4
2

10 to 12 servings 
Eggnog

1 12-oz. container
(4-1/2 cups) La Creme 
whipped topping with 
real cream, thawed 

6 eggs
1 cup milk
2 tablespoons

sugar
2 teaspoons vanilla 

1/4 teaspoon ground

nutmeg 
Dash of salt

Place 3 cups whipped top­
ping and remaining ingredients 
in blender container. Cover; 
process on high speed until 
well blended. Pour into serving 
bowl; top with remaining 
whipped topping.

Eight 1 /2-cup servings

Rick’s Repair Service
Will Be Open Soon

To Repair All Small 
Appliances & Lawn mowers.

Rick T-.Galt, Owner
Maple

the

Thursday, December 1st

Hurst Department Store
Where The Customer Comes First, Always

110 MAIN

Jack Winters Coordinates +
Coeds Coordinates 

Jo Hardin Slacks 
Sunny South Blouses 
Act I Dresses 

Act II Dresses 

Act HI Coordinates
Shrader Sports (Larger Sizes)

Playtex Lingerie 

Shadow Line Lingerie 
Full Line Junior Weaf' 

Chic Jeans 

Wrangler Jeans

featuring
Large Selection Leather, 

Vinyl & Cloth Purses

Hanes Hosiery

Fieldcrest Home Furnishings

Towels & Comforters

Electric Blankets, 
Sheets & Pillow Cases

Shoe Department
Freeman 

Kids Tennis Shoes 

Adidas 

Red Wing Boots
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Smoked Meat Gift Packages Popular Holiday Gifts
Mail-order gift packages 

of smoked cured ham, 
bacon, sausage or turkey are 
increasingly popular holiday 
gifts.

But those receiving smok­
ed meats may wonder about 
its quality and edibility after 
weeks in storage and tran­
sit, says a Texas A&M Uni­
versity Agricultural Exten­
sion Service nutritionist.

“ Mail-order gift packages 
from .tputable dealers are 
safe for consumption, so you 
need not worry about giving 
them as gifts or using them

yourself,”  advises Marilyn 
Haggard, a foods and nutri­
tion specialist.

‘‘The products are highly 
processed and contain pre­
servatives, allowing them to 
be mailed without refrigera­
tion,” she explains.

But the meats should still 
be inspected before eating, 
cautions, Haggard. After 
opening the package, look 
for signs of spoilage such as 
a rotten or putrid smell. 
Foods with a questionable 
odor should not be used or 
even tasted.,

Muleshoe Firm Named As 
AgriTech Distributor

Burst AgriTech, Inc. has 
added a Muleshoe company 
to its direct-distributor net­
work for Burst Yield Boost­
er, an organic plant bioreg­
ulator.

Western 66 Company will 
distribute the all-natural 
product which has proved 
successful through three 
growing seasons in Texas’ 
Rio Grande Valley.

Burst Yield Booster con­
tains Cytogen, a cytokinin 
substance which joins with 
natural plant hormones to 
increase yields in vege­
tables, grains and cotton.

“ We look forward to 
working with Joe King and 
his employees in the mar­
keting of Burst,” says Dr. 
Jerry V. Mayeux, Burst 
AgriTech’s chairman, presi­
dent and chief executive off­
icer. “ Growers in this area 
will get much assistance and 
professional expertise from 
the company on the use of 
the product," Mayeux 
notes, “ since Western 66 
Company has committed its 
resources and personnel to 
the completion of more than 
60 hours of classroom and 
field training in Crop Phy- 
silolgy Management and the 
use of Burst. We are happy 
with this commitment and 
will do everything possible 
to support the company’s 
education and sales 
efforts.”

Burst Yield Booster helps 
modify a plant’s physiology 
through hormonal activity, 
whifh increases per-acre 
yields and profits to the 
farmer. The increased root 
development and growth 
provides better tolerance to 
stress conditions. Vegetative 
growth is affected by in­
creased branching and tiller­
ing; reproductive ability is 
enhanced by increased fe­

male vigor, increased fruit 
set and earlier maturity.

Burst AgriTech also pro­
duces Jump, a plant bioreg­
ulator for the consumer mar­
ket which promotes growth 
and yield increases in house 
plants, lawns and gardents. 
In addition, the company 
engages in research on a 
broad range of bioregulator 
.products which also promote 
plant growth enhancement 
and yield increase.

Also inspect the food for 
signs of surface mold grow­
th. Mold of this type is not 
poisonous but must be re­
moved before the meat is 
used, says the specialist.

According to Haggard, 
you can trim off any mold 
and the meat directly under 
it, or scrub the mold off with 
a brush and vinegar wash. A 
vinegar wash can be made 
by mixing one part viengar 
to three parts water. Rinse 
the wash off with plain 
water.

For maximum flavor from 
smoked cured meat, Hagg­
ard recommends rapid use. 
Bacon can be stored in a 
refrigerator at 35 to 40 de­
grees F for seven days. A 
whole ham can be refirger 
ated for seven days, a half 
for three to five days and 
slices for three days.

Smoked sausage keeps 
well when refrigerated for 
up to seven days and dry or 
semi-dry sausage and cured 
smoked turkey will keep for 
two to three weeks.

Since frozen cured meat 
loses quality rapidly, you 
should not plan on long 
freezer storage, says Hag­
gard. Bacon should be froz­
en at zero degrees F for one

Protect Your Credit Cards 
While Holiday Shopping

A booming business in 
bank credit card fraud 
means consumers need to 
be careful about credit pur­
chases during the hectic 
holiday shopping season, 
says home economist Nancy 
Granovsky.

The most common fraud 
is unauthorized use of a lost 
or stolen card, says Grano­
vsky, a specialist with the 
Texas A&M University 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice. Counterfeit cards, the 
theft of card blanks and card 
numbers obtained through 
telephone orders are used in 
more sophisticated frauds, 
she explains.

“ In most cases, the key to 
fraudulent use is access to 
the card or the card num­
ber,” says Granovsky.

To protect credit c*rds 
she suggests that consumers 
take the following steps:

* When shopping, be 
careful about the carbons on 
charge slips since they can 
be used to change amounts 
on the charge slip. Make 
sure the sales person re­
moves the carbon after the 
slip has been signed, or 
remove it yourself along

Childhood - Teen Obesity
Obesity is so difficult to 

reverse that it is easier to 
prevent it in childhood and 
adolescence than to cure it, 
says nutritionist Dr. Alice 
Hunt.

About 80 percent of over­
weight children become 
overweight adults, reports 
Hunt, a foods and nutrition 
specialist with Texas A&M’s 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice. At least 10 to 20 per­
cent of adolescents are 
obese, notes the specialist.

Most researchers argue 
that obesity is usually the 
result of attitudes and beha­
viors which lead to over­
consumption of food and un­
deractivity. Because these 
attitudes and behaviors are 
difficult to change? between 
75 and 95 percent of the 
people who lose weight will 
eventually regain it, says 
Hunt.

“ Inherited metabolic fac­
tors, or differences in the' 
way individuals use food 
energy, do have an impact 
on obesity. But that doesn’t 
mean the children of over­
weight adults must necess­
arily become obese,” says 
Hunt. “ While it’s clear that 
obesity is familial, the rela­

tive importance of genetics 
and family environment has 
not been determined.”

According to Hunt, lack of 
participation in sports, 
games and other physical 
activities, dependence on 
the car and hours of sitting 
in front of a television are 
contributing factors in child­
hood and adolescent obe- 
sity.

Parents sometimes consi­
der childhood obesity to be 
harmless “ baby fat,” says 
Hunt, and then are sur­
prised when the excess 
weight does not go away as 
the child enters adoles­
cence.

A weight problem can 
easily grow during adole­
scence, since teenagers 

'often overeat as a way of 
coping. The problem* that 
face every adolescent may

appear overpowering to 
them and they withdraw 
from social contact, become 
increasingly inactive, seek 
comfort in food and grow 
progressively fatter, says 
Hunt.

Diet dines where teen­
agers are put on a re­
duced-calorie diet have 
about a 50% drop out rate. 
Behavior modification pro­
grams which include chang­
ing habits, nutrition educa­
tion and exercise, have a 
higher success rate than 
traditional dieting, says the 
nutritionist.

But parent participation in 
weight-control programs 
with their teenagers are 
probably the best for 
long-term weight loss partly 
because parents learn how 
to support their teenagers 
and help them set realistic 
goals about weight manage­
ment.

with the customer’s copy.
* Avoid giving your credit 

card number over the phone 
if at all possible.

* Keep all charge slips so 
you can check your state­
ment to make sure each 
charge is legitimate. If some 
are fraudulent, call the card 
issuer immediately.

* Know the law. You are 
liable only for the first $50 
charged to your account by 
an illegal user. You do not 
have to pay for any unaut­
horized charges made after 
you notify the card company 
of loss or theft of your card. 
So if you act quickly enough, 
you may not have any loss.

* Keep a credit card reg­
ister listing all your credit 
cards, account numbers and 
the address or telephone 
Dumber of who to notify in 
Case of.loss..or theft. Keep 
this list in a safe place, such 
as a safety deposit box.

* Carry with you only 
those cards you need. For 
example, don’t carry a de­
partment store credit card 
unless you intend to shop 
there. Leave a list of the 
cards you have with you at 
home.

“ Some consumers buy 
credit card insurance which 
may be unnecessary if they 
will take reasonable precau­
tions,” says Granovsky. 
With the $50 liability limit, 
the cost of insurance can be 
greater than any loss you 
might have from fraudulent 
use of your card, she adds.

month or less and ham for 
only one to two months. 
Turkey can be frozen for 
three to six months, but 
freezing is not recommend­
ed for sausage.

Cured meats are safe 
when frozen for longer per­
iods of time, but there may 
be a drop-off in taste that 
make the gift less enjoyable, 
notes the specialist.

Enochs News
By

Mrs. J.D. Bayless
Mrs. Buford Peterson was 

in Lubbock Monday to be 
with the family of Mrs. 
Peterson's son-in-law, Har­
old Abney’s mother while 
she had surgery at the 
Methodist Hospital, she also 
visited Mrs. Earl Abney who 
had surgery recently at 
Methodist Hospital also.

Mrs. Winnie Byars drove 
to Lubbock last Sunday and 
visited her daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Parr, she also visited Mrs. 
Alene Byars who had surg­
ery recently. A granddaugh­
ter, the Rany Robinsons at 
Whitharral and Mrs. Ollie 
Cook at Levelland.

*•*
Mrs. Johnie Cox drove to 

Pep, New Mexico last Mon­
day to visit her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Tivis.

***
The Senior Citizens had 

their meeting Monday at 
8:00 p.m. at the Community 
Center. They voted to 
change their time to 7:00 
p.m. There were 12 in 
attendance, Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Petree, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clifford Snitker, Mr. 
and Mrs. J.D. Bayless, Mrs. 
Etta Layton, Mrs. Winnie 
Byars, Mr. and Mrs. Garvin 
Long and Mr. and Mrs. 
Willie Welch, they enjoyed 
playing 42 and dominoes
and visiting.•••

Guest Friday till Sunday 
afternoon in the home of 
Mrs. Winnie Byars were her 
sister, Mrs. Ruby Nichols of 
Lubbock and Mrs. Myrtle 
Hall from Denver, Colorado, 
they ‘ also attended church 
with Wihnie -at the Baptist 
Church.

***
Wesley Autry of Pep, 

New Mexico, is staying with 
his grandparents the Edd 
Autrys and helping Donnye 
Baker with the harvest.

Mrs. Winiiie Byars, Mrs. 
Dean McBee, Mrs. Guy 
Sanders and Mrs. Chester 
Petree were in Littlefield 
shopping and took Mrs. 
G.O. Smith a gift from her 
Sunday School class. She is 
still a patient in the Little­
field Medical Center.

Dennis Turney and Kenny 
Turnev went to south Texas

15%  Discount
Everything In Store 

Now To Christmas

Register For Dec. 23 Drawing
1. Madame Alexander

2. Brass Pieces

Antiques & Junk
109 S. First

272-5275

Dot’s Shop
Close-Out

Sale
Continuing

Melt In Your-Mouth Doughnuts 
Ready To Eat In Minutes

CELEBRATING 90th. BIRTHDAY...Rosie McKillio will be 
celebrating her 90th birthday with a reception on Sunday, 
Dec. 4 from 2 until 4 p.m. at the Civic Center, hosted by her 
children. All of her friends are welcome to join her in this 
celebration. She is requesting no gifts, please. She was bom 
Dec. 5, 1893, in Pottawama County, Okla. She moved to 
Muleshoe in 1928, and has made her home here since that 
time. She and Luther McKillip were married September 20, 
1914. She has 6 children, 14 grandchildren, 29 great 
grandchildren and one great great grandchild. She is a 
resident of the Muleshoe Nursing Home. She raised flowers, 
was a seamstress and crochet for a hobby, prior to entering 
the nursing home.

For a quick breakfast or coffee treat, make up a batch 
of Speedy Orange Glazed Doughnuts-in minutes. The rec­
ipe for these melt-in-your-mouth doughnuts sidesteps all 
the fuss of traditional homemade doughnuts by starting 
with refrigerated biscuits.

Simply make a hole in the center of each biscuit and 
fry in hot shortening or oil. Then dip the light, tender 
doughnuts in the tangy orange glaze given here or another 
favorite glaze or frosting.

SPEED Y  O R A N G E  G L A Z E D  D O U G H N U TS

GLAZE
1 1/3 cups sifted powdered sugar 

2 tablespoons orange juice 
2 teaspoons grated orange peel

DOUGHNUTS
7.5-oz. can Pillsbury Refrigerated Buttermilk 

or Country Biscuits 
Shortening or oil for frying

Heat shortening to 375°F. In small bowl, combine sug 
ar, orange juice and peel; set aside. Separate dough into 10 
biscuits. Using thimble or small round cookie cutter, cut 
hole in center of each biscuit. Fry biscuits and holes in 
hot shortening (375°F.) until golden brown, about 1 1/2 
to 2 minutes. Drain. While hot, dip both sides of dough­
nut into glaze. Serve warm. 10 doughnuts.

6The Fingertip World
Of Classifieds'

Call 272 4536

Thursday deer hunting.
•••

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Key 
attended the funeral service 
of a brother-in-law, E.G. 
Butler 2:00 p.m. Monday, 

^Nov. 14 at the Funeral 
Chapel in Weatherford.

**•
Bula and Enochs Baptist 

Churches are sponsoring a 
Mexican Mission, they will 
meet Tuesday nights at the 
Bula Baptist Church till they 
can get a church organized. 

«♦*
1 Mrs. Juanita Snow of 
Muleshoe was a visitor at 
the Baptist Church Sunday 
morning and visited her sis­
ter in the afternoon.

***
Mrs. Oleta Burris of Well­

man spent Saturday night 
with her sister and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Layton, 
and attended church with 
them Sunday morning.

The Mexicans are attend­
ing Sunday school at the 
Baptist Church, there were 
aproximatly 30 visitors Sun­
day morning.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Key 

visited a nephew Larry How­
ard at the Lubbock General 
Hospital Saturday, and visit­
ed Mrs. Homar Howard, 
Larrys mother, and her 
granddaugher. Mr. and Ms. 
Sid Key went with them to 
Lifbbock.

***
Marsha. Amy, Kevin and 

Kyle of Muleshoe, spent last 
weekend with their grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. El- 
wood Autry.

•**
Mrs. Darlene Alexander 

under went surgery on her 
shoulder at Lubbock General 
hospital in Lubbock, Mon­
day, Nov. 14.

R e d W i n g s
HURST DEPT. STORE

Closed Monday Open 9 a.m. Tuesday |

Notions |  /
All Patterns

/ 2  Price 5 0 L
All B u tto n s

& ZiPPen 1 0*  ̂ C arH Fabrics
m g

1 Table $1°° / 2  Price

The am azing electric heat pump.
Most heating units are inefficient because they have to 

create heat.
There s one that doesn t the electric heat pump, 

one of the most efficient wdVs to heat and cool your home.
In the winter it gathers heat from outdoors to warm your 
home...and in the summer it reverses itself to become an 
air conditioner.

Helping you use electricity more efficiently is another 
way we re working to justify your trust. For more information, 
contact your Southwestern Public Service Company manager

SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY
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Police/Sheriff
Cont. From Page 1

unidentified car.
Kenneth Harris reported 

to police on November 20 
the theft of a 12 gauge 
shotgun from a rack in his 
pickup. The gun was valued 
at $130. On November 18,
Roland Bell reported a mis­
chief occurrence when the 
window of a postal jeep was 
broken. Approximately $75 
in damages were done, but 
no suspects were named. On 
November 19, Raymond 
Gaede reported to police 
that he had found a purse 
and contents by his garage 
door. The purse contained 
no identification and re­
mains in the property de­
partment of the police.

On November 19, Clar­
ence David Shields reported 
the theft of a motor vehicle 
from behind his residence.
Two rifles were in the vehi­
cle. No suspects were nam­
ed at the time. On Novem­
ber 18, officers arrested 
Jessie Camarillo on a capias 
pro warrant. He was jailed, 
pending bond.

On November 20, Jesus 
Triana Garcia was arrested 
on a charge of alleged driv­
ing while intoxicated. He 
was placed in the county 
jail, pending bond. On Nov­
ember 17, Georgia Casto- 
rena was arrested on a 
capias pro warrant. She paid 
a $30 fine and cleared the 
warrant. Also on the 17th,
Eulalio Martinez, Jr. was 
arrested on a FTA (failure to 
appear) warrant for a traffic 
violation. He was released 
after paying $100 fine.
Harry Sandoval was arrest­
ed on November 17 on a 
capias pro warrant and 
placed in Bailey County Jail.
On that same date. Rene 
Sandoval was also arrested 
on a capias pro warrant and 
placed in the Bailey County 
Jail. Alonso Ontiveroz was 
arrested onNovember 17 on 
a capias pro warrant. He 
paid a $40 fine and was 
released. Pedro Vega was 
arrested on November 16 on 
an FTA warrant and booked 
into Bailey County Jail.

On November 16, officers 
arrested Jose Delao on a 
charge of alleged criminal 
mischief at the Catholic 
Center parking lot. He was 
arraigned before Justice of 
the Peace Jack Bates and., 
bond set at $500. He was 
placed in jail pending bond.
On November 16, city offi­
cers had reported to them a 
rape. Investigation is still 
ongoing.

On November 10, officers 
anested Marjorie Olson on 
charges of alleged DWI. She 
was placed in the county jail 
pending bond. Also arrested 
on that date was Anthony 
Allen Slattery for alleged 
public intoxication and dis­
orderly conduct. He was a 
passenger in the Olson veh­
icle. He also was placed in 
jail pending bond.

On November 11, Maria 
Guerrera was arrested on an 
FTA warrant for violation of 
city ordinance. She was tak­
en before the judge on the 
warrant.

Isreal Reyna, Sr. was 
arrested on November 16 on 
highway patrol warrants. 
He was transported to the 
Bailey County Jail and book­
ed pending bond. On Nov­
ember 11, Sammy Torres 
Martinez was arrested on 
alleged charges of public 
intoxication. He was trans­
ported to the county jail and 
booked pending bond. On 
November 13, Jose Rodri­
guez was arrested on a 
charge of alleged DWI. He 
was placed in the county 
jail, pending bond.

On November 13, Maria 
Baca was arrested on an 
FTA warrant for traffic vio­
lations. She paid $155 in 
fines. Lori Leal was arrested

NFR...
Cont. From Page 1

All-Around Cowboy, are de­
cided during this perform­
ance.

Recognized as the ‘‘World 
Series” or “ Super Bowl” of 
ProRodeo, the NFR climaxes 
more than 600 Professional 
Rodeo Cowboys Association 
(P.R.C.A.) sanctioned rod­
eos held throughout the Uni­
ted States and Canada in 
1983.

At the NFR, the top 15 
money winners for the year 
in the six standard Pro- 
Rodeo events will vie for 
world championship titles 
and a portion of the largest 
purse in rodeo history. The 
telecast will carry bareback 
bronc riding, steer wrest­
ling, team roping, saddle 
bronc riding, calf roping and 
bull riding. Women’s Pro­
fessional Rodeo Association 
barrel racing will also be 
featured.

Commercial announce­
ments during the telecast 
will feature the Prime Line 
of farm equipment available 
from Hesston Corporation, 
plus Hesston’s new collec­
tor’s rodeo belt buckle. The 
new 1983 Anniversary 
buckle is the first edition in 
an all-new Hesston buckle 
series. It is available at par­
ticipating Hesston dealers.

on November 11 on FTA 
warrant for traffic violations. 
The warrant was cleared 
afterfines of $157 were paid.

On November 12, Bobby 
Free reported a criminal 
mischief occurence to police 
after someone shot out the 
windows of his wife’s auto. 
A drive shaft was also re­
ported as missing. No sus­
pects were named. On Nov­
ember 19, Thursie Reid re­
ported the theft of an air 
conditioning unit. The unit 
was removed from a resid­
ence at 1103 Avenue J. It 
was valued at $700.

Protest •••
Cont. From Page 1 
average of the other four 
will be taken. This “ high 
four” average will be substi­
tuted for any of the actual 
yields of the last three years 
that fall below that average. 
Then the 1984 payment 
yield will be set at the larger 
of (1) the adjusted average 
for the last three years of (2) 
80 percent of the farm’s 
1983 payment yield.

The same procedure was 
used in 1983 except that % 
minimum of 90 percent of 
the previous year’s payment 
yield was used. Thus produ­
cers who have suffered re­
cent disasters will be subject 
to a 20 percent yield reduc­
tion in 1984 instead of the 
maximum 10 percent reduc­
tion that was in effect for 
1983.

This effectively reduces 
potential producer income, 
Fondren points out, which 
will serve as a disincentive 
to farm lending agencies in 
a program already devoid of 
incentives.

“ The severity and fre­
quency of our weather disas­
ters in recent years is an ob­
vious abnormality and 
should be treated as such,” 
states PCG Executive Vice 
President Donald Johnson. 
"So we are urging the Sec­
retary to use his authority to 
rescind the arbitrary lower­
ing of the 1984 minimum 
from 90 percent to 80 per­
cent of 1983 yields.”

Boosters •••
Cont. From Page 1 
urged to attend and join in 
these meetings. The FFA 
Boosters is a non-profit or­
ganization and all funds 
raised are used to help furt­
her ag projects and ag stu­
dents in their efforts at 
Muleshoe.

Ag Computer Seminar Planned Tuesday
Computerized agriculture 

is no longer a dream of the 
future - it is a part of the 
present. Computers are 
used to give telephone num­
bers, calculate loan repay­
ments, report market infor­
mation, operate parts of’' 
equipment and send out 
bills. They are now also 
available to agricultural pro­
ducers to help increase pro­
fits and decrease costs.

Ag Computer Service, 
Inc., (ACS) is conducting a 
free agriculture computer 
seminar November 29 at 
7:30 p.m. in the Summitt 
Savings Assn. The ideas to 
be presented include how 
computers are being used 
on farms and ranches today

plus the basic computer 
parts and terms. They will 
have demonstration pro­
grams for crops, livestock, 
accounting and cashflow. 
The meeting will be inter­
esting to beginners and 
computer owners.

The program will be con­
ducted by Dr. Ray Samm­
ons, President of ACS and 
past Texas A&M Extension 
Economist. He, along with 
CPAs and local area produc­
ers developed most of the 
programs used by ACS. Mr. 
Don Glenn, also with ACS, 
will present part of the pro­
gram. Mr. Glenn was born 
and raised in Panhandle 
agriculture. Dick Chitwood, 
local dealer for ACS, will

Search Underway 
For Texas Rural Hero

Who will succeed little 
Chris and Amy Wilhite of 
Hopkins County, winners of 
the 1982 Texas Rural Hero­
ism Award? There may be 
dozens of dramatic, life-sav­
ing incidents this year which 
could qualify for the 1983 
Rural Heroism Award.

The searcii is under way 
for the 1983 Texas Rural 
Heroism Award for that per­
son or persons judged to 
have performed an heroic 
deed during a time of crisis, 
according to Ben Bullard, 
Council president and assis­
tant safety director for the 
Texas Farm Bureau.

March 1, 1984, is the 
deadline for entries to be 
received by the Rural Hero­
ism Award Committee, Tex­
as Farm and Ranch Safety 
Council, P.O. Box 489,

Wilhite
Rural

Soil,
Cont. From Page 1
a compacted soil and keep 
any pans to a minimum of 
the field.

Make sure every trip is 
justified, . and combine 
operations for fewer passes.

Disk equipment will not 
disrupt a serious compaction 
problem. It can’t plow deep 
enough. Use a chisel only as 
deep as the bottom of the 
compacted zone.

And do it early. Take

Waco, Texas 76703.
Chris and Amy 

received the 1982 
Heroism Award last April in 
Houston for their efforts in 
saving the life of their fat­
her, Steve Wilhite whose 
right arm was mangled in a 
hay-baler in June, 1982.

The heroic act or 
human-life-saving deed 
must have occurred in Texas 
during 1983 and should be 
related to farming or ranch­
ing. Nominations should in­
clude a written account of 
the incident and the names, 
addresses and telephone 
numbers of all persons in­
volved. Newspaper clippings 
and photos should also 
accompany the nominations, 
if available.

The 1983 Rural Heroism 
Award will be presented 
during the Monday morning 
opening general session of 
the 45th annual Tex- 
as/Southwestem Safety 
Conference and Exposition, 

-March 19, 1984, at the Hyatt 
Regency Hotel in Dallas.

Drive.,.
Cont. From Page 1

“ Make an appointment to 
donate. Call 272-5517 or just 
drop in,” Say spokesmen for 
the United Blood Service. 

Remember for Christmas

aslo be present to help with 
the program.

ACS, is an Amarillo com-

Research spending 
at Texas A&M tops 
100 million dollars

C O L L E G E  STATION — 
Kcsearch spending at Texas 
A&M University, the state's 
leading institution in research 
expenditures, has topped SI00 
million for the first time, uni­
versity officials announced 
Monday.

The record total for the 19S2 
83 fiscal year which ended ii 
August was $103.8 million, an 
increase of nearly $12 million 
over last year.

laist year Texas A&M led the 
state's colleges and universities 
in research funding, accounting 
for 41 percent of all such expen­
ditures in Texas. The National 
Science Foundation ranked 
Texas A&M among the top 20 
institutions nationally in re­
search s|X‘ndii)g.

*  *  *  *
There is great danger 

that what we consider 
important is unimportant.

pany dedicated to applying 
computer technology to 
assist the average agricul­
tural producer. They write 
programs so producers can 
use the speed of the compu­
ter to gather, organize, sum­
marize and analyze financial 
and production information 
from their farms and ran­
ches.

A  relief pitcher is allowed 
eight warm-up pitches when 
he comes into a baseball 
game.

s 105»
HI PROTEIN 
DOG FOOD

• A  26 %  crude protein dog food
• Formulated for hard wot king dogs
• For peak conditioning and performance

advantage of any repetitive f^’fthis year give blood I
jpMBER 7th, from 1:00 p.m.

Gold Star
winter freeze, 
rains to help 
and pulverize 
chiseled clods.

thaws and 
break down 
the exposed

to 7:00 p.m. in the Fellow­
ship Hall of the First United 
Methodist Chruch.

Cont. From Page 1 
The awards presentations ment program of the Texas

Shopping...
Cont. From Page 1
on having a coordinated 
Washington’s birthday sale 
in February. The sale will 
start on Monday, February 
20 and will run through 
Wednesday, February 22. 
All businesses are encour­
aged to part ipate.

Businesses represented at 
the meeting were Albert­
son's, Higginbotham-Bart- 
eltt, Bratcher Motor Supply, 
Perry's, Anthony’s, Mule­
shoe Supermarket, James 
Crane Tire Co., A&M Farm 
Supply, Pay-N-Save, and 
Serv-All Thriftway.

wre narrated by Earl Broseh 
of Lockney, chairman of the 
district 4-H council, and 
Chris Caddel of Lubbock, 
council vice chairman. The 
awards were presented by 
Dr. Catherine Crawford and 
Billy C. Gunter, district Ex­
tension directors.

Dinner music was pre­
sented by Kenley Powell, 
Yoakum County 4-H’er. Al­
so on the program were 
4-H members Bryan Shaw of 
Gaines County, Sharia Blay 
of Terry County and Kayla 
Gentry of Dawson County.

4-H is the youth develop-

Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, an educational arm of 
the Texas A&M University 
System.

Ellis Funeral Home
Pre-Need Funeral Needs 

Price Is Frozen At Time Of Purchase & Guaranteed 
’ 272-4574 Muleshoe

Low Calorie 

Low Cholesterol

Fresh Lamb Meat

Larry Martin
272-3684
After 5 p.m.

i CHRISTMAS 1983
I

CAN BE MEMORABLE 

OCCASION WITH A TREE 

FROM OUR LARGE SUPPLY 

MAKE YOUR SELECTION

m HUMfliNEiTfICS
a  u

BALANCED FARMING OF THE FUTURE

For Soil Rebuilding, Release The Biological 

Energy Trapped In Your Crop Residue.

Get Your Fertility Insurance Today,

For Next Year’s Profits, Use Humalace NOW! 

Decompose Corn, Milo & Sun Flowers Stalks 

Before 1984 Planting

Ted Millen - 806-965-2733

NOW!
WE ALSO FEATURE: j

★  FLOCKING 3

★  TABLE SIZED 
TREES

★  TREE STANDS

Happy Holiday Season

from

BAKER FARM SUPPLY

Seminar On

C O M P U T E R S  FOR 
FARM & RANCH

ACS is conducting a free seminar on us­
ing computers as a management tool for 
maximizing profits. Topics will include: 
farm  accounting , crop and livestock  
budgeting, and field record keeping to 
run on a Vector Graphic Computer.

Ray Sammons - Don Glenn

Where: Summit Savings 
Meeting Room

When: November 29 

Time: 7:30 pan.

Authorized Vector Graphic Dealer

/VG COMPUTER 
SERVICE
4037 W. 50th 
P.O. Box 7626 

Amarillo, Texas 79109

• 1532 W. American 272-4613

J * * * * * * * * * * * * *  * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
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College, Vocational Financial 
Aid Available

Eacjh year over $100 
billion of college and voca-‘ 
tional financial aid is avail­
able to families who estab­
lish the need for financial 
assistance. Many families 
could qualify, but they do 
not know how to apply or 
they cannot demonstrate a 
financial need.

Student College Aid can 
assist in both these tasks. 
SCA familiarizes the family 
with the available assistance 
programs and explains how 
they can qualify for this aid.

To apply for financial aid, 
the family completes and 
sends a Financial Aid Form 
(FAF) to College Scholar­
ship Service in Princeton, 
New Jersey. The FAF is 
distributed to high schools, 
post-secondary institutions 
and scholarship agencies. 
The income and asset in­
formation which the family 
writes on this form is anal­
yzed to determine whether a 
financial need exists. (Some 
schools use ACT rather than 
FAF. SCA analyzes both.)

Financial need, according 
to the College Scholarship

Service, is the difference 
between the cost of educa­
tion at an institution and 
what CSS estimates the fam­
ily can reasonably pay. A 
major problem with this 
estimate is that parents who 
appear financially secure 
may appear secure only be­
cause of the way they are 
utilizing their income and 
assets. In reality, this family 
may not be able to afford a 
college of their choice, or 
college at all, without incur­
ring severe financial hard­
ship or debt.

Student College Aid helps 
families earning between 

• $25,000 and $50,000 qualify 
for college funds they other­
wise would not qualify for, 
by demonstrating a greater 
financial need. They also 
help families give their 
children the opportunity to 
attend the college or univer­
sity of their choice.

Student College Aid is a 
new service not offered by 
financial officers, school off­
icials or guidance counse­
lors. For free infomration 
and a College Financial Aid

Farm Bureau 50th 
Meeting Scheduled

The state’s largest farm 
organization, Texas Farm 
Bureau, will hold its 50th 
annual meeting in Houston 
Nov. 27-30, at which time 
over 1,200 voting delegates 
will decide policies for 1984.

Theme of the convention 
at the Shamrock Hilton 
Hotel will be ‘‘Celebrating a 
Golden Harvest.”

Voting delegates from 216 
organized counties will 
adopt state policies for the 
coming year. Approved re­
solutions on national issues 
will be forwarded to the 65th 
annual meeting of the 
American Farm Bureau Fed­
eration which meets Jan. 
8-12, in Orlando, Fla.

Dr. Richard L. Lesher, 
president of the U.S. Cham­
ber of Commerce, will be 
the Keynote speaker. He 
will address the organization 
during the Nov. 28 general 
session.

TFB President S. M. True 
Jr. of Plainview will deliver 
his annual address at the 
same session. TFB Secre­
tary-Treasurer George O. 
White of Harwood will pre­
cede with his annual report.

TFB Executive Director 
Warren Newberry will begin 
the business session on Nov. 
29 with his annual admin­
istrative report. The conven­
tion business will conclude 
on Nov. 30 with the election 
of TFB board members and 

• the TFB presidend.
A young farmer and 

rancher breakfast will be 
held at 6:30 a.m. on Nov. 
28. Jack Jackson of Hurst, 
with the Leadership Deve­
lopment Institute, will be 
the guest speaker.

There will e five confer­
ences conducted from 1 
p.m. to 2:30 p.m. on Nov. 
28. These include field 
crops, livestock, natural re­
sources and education, 
taxes, and transportation

and farm labor.
They will be followed at 

2:45 p.m. by six commodity 
conferences. These include 
beef and sheep and goats; 
cotton and peanuts; dairy 
and poultry; wheat and feed 
grains; rice and soybeans, 
and citrus and pecans.

Youth activities will in­
clude selection of a TFB 
queen from 13 district win­
ners; a talent find winner 
from 13 finalists, and a free 
enterprise speech contest 
winner, chosen from 13 dis­

trict winners.
The speech and talent 

find contest will begin at 7 
p.m. on Nov. 27. The queen 
contest will commence at 7 
p.m. on Nov. 28. Announce­
ment of the Outstanding 
Young Farmer and Rancher 
for the year will be that 
evening also.

The speeclf winner re­
ceives a $2,000 scholarship; 
the runner-up, $1,500, and
the four other finalists, 
$1,000. All 13 district win­
ners are assured this year of 
at least of $750 scholarship.

The talent find winner re­
ceives a $1,500 scholarship, 
the runner-up, $1,000. All 
13 district winners are cer­
tain to win a $500 scholar­
ship.

The queen receives a 
$1,500 scholarship; the run­
ner-up, $1,000. Each of the 
district winners have been 
assured a $500 scholarship.

The Outstanding Young 
Farmer and Rancher will 
receive free use of a 1984 
Ford pickup for one year, 
contributed by Bird-Kultgen 
Ford Co. of Waco, and a 
free trip to the AFBF con­
vention and the AFBF 
Young Farmers and Ranch­
ers Leadership Conference 
February 1984 in Arlington, 
Virginia.

'  &  - H o f o i a u  S w n -
’“'Clvtc Center

Presents

W eekend E scape
$49.95
Per night.

Single or double occupancy 
Friday or Saturday nights.

Escape to Lubbock to have fun, shop 
or just relax. Enjoy one of the luxurious 
suites in the beautiful Atrium Tower. 
Complimentary breakfast in the 
renowned Greenery Restaurant plus 
two complimentary cocktails when you 
visit the Brass Banjo Lounge. You may 
not want to leave the hotel. In addition, 
there is a pool, sauna and whirlpool at 
your disposal.

Call now for reservations and details. 
Mention this ad upon check in.
Offer good thru January 3 1 except November 25 f j  26. 

Subject to availability 

801 Avenue Q
Lubbock, Texas 79401 ^  v / o n 
806/7631200 /A  1 V -ftouaOX) S)Y\JfV

uuAuuumuuuuuu

Muleshoe

Planner, write SCA, Dept. 
DFAP. 3641 Deal St., Hous­
ton, Tx 77025 or phone (713) 
668-7899. SCA is a member 
of the Houston Better Busi­
ness Bureau.

WestPlains 

Medical Center

ADMITTED
Nov. 21-Adele Beaty, 

Ruby Clark and Marshall 
Boney

Nov. 22-Billy Taylor, Jess­
ie Arce, Richard Mitchell, 
Darrell Kennemer and Jack- 
son Robinson

Nov. 23-Sally Schuster, 
Arthur B. Miller, Charles 
Bratcher and April Hamilton

Nov. 24-J.C. Gatewood 
and Gilbert Vela, Jr.

Nov. 25-Bany Lewis

School Menu

Nov. 28-Dec. 2, 1983 
MONDAY 

BREAKFAST
Milk
Toast
Cereal
Fruit

LUNCH
Milk
Steak — Gravy 
Creamed Potatoes 
Eng. Peas 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit

TUESDAY
BREAKFAST

Milk
Toast
Sausage
Jelly
Juice

LUNCH
Milk
Hamburgers 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Tater Tots 
Pickles & Onions

DISMISSED Cobbler
WEDNESDAY

Nov. 21-Teresa Morris, BREAKFAST
Louise Agee, James Robert­ Milk
son, Irene Dyck and Piki Honeybun
Lanham. Juice

Nov. 22-Adele Beaty, LUNCH
Dean Gunstream, Stephanie Milk
Francis, Mica Stevens, Chicken Pot Pie
Shirley Hartline and Barbie Cheese Stick
Seaton Spinach

Nov. 23-J.C. Autrey, Fruit
Annette Bonds, Jessie Arce, Cookie
Lubertha Steptor, Artis Fall- THURSDAY
well and Nancy Cochran BREAKFAST

Nov. 24-Chaib« Bratcher, Milk
April Hamilton, birdie War­ Muffin
ren, Marcia Henry and Fruit
Darrell Kennemer LUNCH

Nov. 25-Maria Guevara Cobbler

Conservation Tillage 
Stretches Rainfall

Doing a better job of con­
serving rainfall may help 
farmers cope with dry condi­
tions such as those that have 
plagued Texas and other 
states this year.

One way to “ stretch” 
rainfall is through conserva­
tion tillage, suggests Dr. Ed 
Colburn, agronomist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service, Texas A&M 
University System.

"Conservation tillage sys­
tems often produce higher 
yields per inch of available' 
water,” notes Colburn, 
“ thus making the best use 
of this valuable resource.”

Conservation tillage gen­
erally refers to tillage oper­
ations that reduce water 
evaporation losses and in­
crease water infiltration into 
the soil.

“ Conservation tillage 
helps improve soil moisture 
conditions by increasing 
water infiltration and slow­
ing evaporation," points out 
Colburn. “ Heavy crop resi­
dues help reduce runoff and 
erosion. Chiseling or sub­
soiling deepens the root 
zone and leaves the soil sur­
face in a rough state to store 
more water.”

A deeper root zone gen­
erally increases the soil 
water storage as a result of 
deep chiseling and improved 
soil organic matter levels, 
says the agronomist. This 
may give an extra inch or 
two of stored moisture that

can help carry the crop 
through low rainfall periods.

“ Although conservation 
tillage practices won’t give 
overnight results, they can
improve soil conditions and 
can start paying dividends 
in several years,” says Col­
burn.

The world's first commej- 
cial jet airliner was the 
Comet I. It was introduced 
in 1952.

Milk
Corn Dogs 
Veg. Beef Soup 
Crackers 
Cinnamon Rolls 
Fruit

FRIDAY
BREAKFAST

Milk
Cinnamon Toast 
Fruit

LUNCH
Milk
Fried Chicken 
Gravy
Green Beans 
Creamed Potatoes 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit

COMBO LINE 
MONDAY 

Milk or Tea
Pizza 
Pickles 
Mixed Veg.
Fruit

TUESDAY 
Milk or Tea 
Hamburgers 
Lettuce & Tomatoes 
Tater Tots 
Pickles & Onions

WEDNESDAY 
Milk or Tea 
Burritos 
Cheese Stick 
Fried Okra 
Jello with Fruit

THURSDAY 
Milk or Tea 
Frito Pie 
Cole Slaw 
Beans 
Crackers 
Fruit

FRIDAY 
Milk or Tea 
Turkey & Gravy 
Creamed Potatoes 
Green Beans 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit

Local Residents 
Niece Dies 
At Lubbock

Services for Joyce Brew­
er, 44, of Lubbock will be at 
1:30 p.m., Tuesday, at the 
Rix Funeral Home of Lub­
bock. She died at approxi­
mately 1 a.m. Thursday at 
her home.

She was born in Clovis, 
N.M. and lived most of her 
life in Lubbock. She was 
employed in food service.

Survivors include: one 
son, Glen Morgan of Lub- 
bokc; one daughter, Anita 
Austin of Lubbock; her mot­
her Pat Chastin of Lubbock; 
three brothers, Lonnie and 
Wesley Brewer, both of San , 
Lorenzo, Calif., and Dwight .1 
King of Lubbock; two sis­
ters, Billie Lawson of Lub-r 
bock and Yvonne Mitchell of 
Kilgore; and two grand­
children.

She was a niece of Mrs. 
Pearl Cox and Mrs. Ray 
Carter of Muleshoe and a 
cousin of Mrs. Ted Millsap 
and J.R. Carter also of 
Muleshoe.

Agriculture Energy Outlook Is Good

Your Authorized

ATARI
Sales & Service 

Dealer

Williams Brosr Office Supply

322 MAIN 272-3113

y T u tZ V a m tij
HAWOWAftf STO ftfS

TOOL VALUE
OF THE MONTH

MECHANIC £>

mile Supplies 
lilt

15-In. Multi Bar
Ideal lot pulling and pounding 
nails, scraping prying Forged 
tempered steel M M M B -15  

Quantities Limited

F ry & Cox, Inc.
%

At a time when even the 
slightest hint of good news 
for agriculture has a major 
impact, farmers should be 
pleased with the energy out­
look for the year ahead.

If projections hold true, 
farmers should face steady 
energy supplies at lower 
costs in 1984. And this in 
itself should brighten agri­
cultural prospects for next 
year, says an economist with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service, Texas 
A&M University System.

Dr. Forrest Stegelin sees 
gasoline prices drifting as 
much as 4 percent below the 
1983 average and diesel fuel 
dipping as much as 6 per­
cent under this year’s ave­
rage. LP gas, meanwhile, is 
not expected to decline but 
should increase no more

Inman Services 

Held ,Friday 

At Snyder
Funeral services for E.M. 

"Jack” Inman. 83, of Sny­
der were held at 10 a.m. 
Friday, Nov. 25 in the Sny­
der First Baptist Church 
with the Rev. Ken Branam, 
pastor, officiating. Assisted 
by the Rev. E.K. Shepherd, 
pastor of the Brownfield 
First Baptist Church.

Interment was in Snyder 
Cemetery under the direc­
tion of Bell-Seale Funeral 
Home of Snyder. Inman 
died Tuesday night in Sny­
der Oaks Nursing Center 
following a lengthy illness.

Born in Mena, Ark., In­
man moved to Snyder more 
than 50 years ago and was a 
Snyder policeman 17 years 
before retiring in 1965. He 
was Snyder’s first paid fire- 
figher. He married Lucy 
Mae Hull on June 20, 1927, 
in Big Lake. She died in 
1976. He was a Baptist.

Survivors include a
daughter, Barbara White of 
Houston; a son, Norman of 
Woodland; seven sisters, 
Cora Shearer of Lamesa, 
Maudie Chandler of Oregon, 
Melvina Nelson of Brown­
field, Florence Davies of 
New Home, Nora Bell Wood 
of Tahoka, Mary Ellen
James of Lubbock and 
Ometha Walton of Colo­
rado; two brothers, Sherman 
of Muleshoe and Travis of 
Tahoks; six grandchildren; 
and three great grandchild­
ren.

than 5 percent.
The economist expects 

electricity prices to remain 
steady for the most part, 
with a possible decrease of 
about 2 percent.

Any price increases that 
might occur for gasoline, 
diesel, LP gas or electricity 
will be less than the 1984 
rate of inflation, which is 
projected at 4.4 percent, 
notes Stegelin.

However, natural gas 
prices will likely increase 
between 6 and 9 percent in 
1984. This is due to the 
on going partial control of 
wellhead natural gas prices 
mandated by the Natural 
Gas Policy Act of 1978.

Stegelin points out that 
these energy projections are 
based on overall improve­

ment in the U.S. economy 
through the rest of 1983 and 
into 1984.

~r

Enochs News
By

Mrs. J.D.Baylesa

Bret Alexander, son of 
Mrs. Darlene Alexander, 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. 
Stuff Jones left Wednesday, 
November 16 for his basic 
training for the Air Force at 
San Antonio. He has stayed tt 
with his grandparents and 
finished high school at 
Three Way.

Classified Ads 

Call 272 4556

iin JJJjjsr
OUMMSaU BUICK PONTIAC

ROBERT D. GREEN, IN C
OB W. AMERICAN »LVO. — MULESHOE. TEXAS 7BI47

—  HOME OF iA e GREEN MACHINES —

Terry Yell
Sales Representative 272 4948'

■US. PH. 
BBS I7MSBS 
BM TRS-Xm

Auction
Saturday December 10

2:30 p.m.

Knowles Auction
516North. First Muleshoe 

Infomation C a l 272-4993 or 272-3187

License Tx i-021-0969

STOc h

MIRRORS

Consignments Welcome

(Bring Early If You Want It 

Advertised & In Hand Bills)

aid]

1 I

Q Q

401 S. 1st 2724511
Knottier ent pptionai hotel owned and operated by Jd»»n Q  Hamntom HrtteK bn

. ••mr ••m

Clovis
2600 E. M abry Dr.

Portales
1601 So. Ave. D

Muleshoe
1302 W . Am erican Blvd.

W

1 ,

19  ;

Activity Center
• 10 fun things to learn.
• Push button, turn knob, phone dial, ring bell 

& more.
• Fasten to crib rails & mesh playpens.
• For 3 mos. to 18 mos.

Pocket Simon®
• Miniature version of 

the famous electronic 
game.

• 1 or more players.
• For 7 years to adult.
• No. 4046

8 "

' s t m o i i

STOMPERH
AUTHENTIC 4x4s

• Has 2 gears for adjustable power & speed.
• Stunt wheel, super wide tread tires 8i working 

headlights.
• Battery included.
• For 4 years & up.
• No. 863

S o f s k i n '
u r i  $ « f iU R

• Soft 12" life-like baby.
• Turning head, open 4 closing eyes
• Drinks 4 wets, can be bathed.
• No. 2301 g g g
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DEADLINE FOR CLASSIFIED
ADS IS TUESDAYS AND  

FRIDAYS 11:00 A M
CLASSIFIED RATES 

1st Insertion 
Per Word....S. 15 

Minimum Charge...$2.30 
2nd Insertion

Per Word.....$.13
Minimum Charge...$2.00 

CARD OF THANKS
Per Word..... $.20

CLASSIFIED DISPLAY 
$1.70..per column inch 

BLIND AD RATES 
50% more 

DEADLINES 
11 a.m. Tues. for Thurs. 

11 a.m. fri. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

ANY AD. NOT 
RESPONSIBLE FOR 

ANY ERROR AFTER AD 
HAS RUN ONCE.

AFTER
DEADLINE???

You can call 272-4536 

until 5:00 p.m. 

on Friday and Tuesday 

and get your WORD AD 

in

T00-LATE-T0 CLASSIFY 

in the next issue! 11

Tuesday for Thursday 

and Friday for Sunday.

1. PERSONALS 3. HELP WANTED

"Free mail-order sheet 
music and song book cata­
log. Write Alpha Music 
Center, 711 West 29th St., 
Austin Texas 78705. Call 
512-477-5009” . 
l-47s-4tp

NEED CREDIT! 
GUARANTEED! Receive 
Master Card/Visa with no 
credit check. Bad/no credit 
ok. For free brochure send 
self-addressed stamped en-‘ 
velope to Capitol, Box 
821428, Dallas, Texas 75382 
or call 214-234-3726 anytime 
l-47t-8tc

WANTED - EXPERIENCED 
Nursery Keeper for Sunday 
Morning Service at the New 
Covenant Church. Call 
272-3817
3- 47s-tfc

I 4, HOUSES FOR RENT |

For Rent - 2 Bedroom House 
in Muleshoe. Single car 
garage. Fenced yard. Call 
965-2320 before 7:30 a.m. or 
after 6:30 p.m.
4- 47t-tfc

CONCERNED 
about someone’s 

drinking
HELP IS AVAILABLE 

through Al-Anon 
Call 227-2350 or 965-2207 or 
come to visit Tuesday 
nights. 8:00 p.m. at 1116 W. 
American Boulevard, Mule­
shoe.

allilf
5. APTS. FOR RENT

2. LOST AND FOUND

Lost 13 Oka Steers branded 
KX on left hip. Call J.R. 
Wilkerson 265-3447.
2- 47s-3tc

| 3. HELP WANTED

Ladies, help meet those 
EXTRA EXPENSES' Join 
our Dymatic 30 year old 
fashion Co. Show our 
“ Latest” line of co-ordi­
nates on the home show 
plan 2-3 evenings a week! 
NO CASH Simple invest­
ment! Much More shared at 
interview. If over 21 with a 
car and phone call 385-3989 
or 385-6658.
3- 45s-lmsc

Beauticians Needed.
277,-3448.
tltc-37t-tfc

....-....... .
Registered Nurse Visiting 
Nurse Supervisor for Bailey 
and Parmer Counties, ex­
cellent Negociable salary & 
benefits. Monday - Friday 
8-5 Contact Visiting Nurse 
Service Inc. Lubbock (806) 
793-9067.

, 3-44t-8tc

Now Accepting Job Appli­
cations for Hurst’s Depart­
ment Store, former St. Clair. 
Send Application to P.O. 
Box 530 or to Hurst’s De­
partment Store, 327 N. Bur­
lington, Spur, Tx.
(806) 271-3351.
Opening November 15th. 
tltc-42s-tfc

Part-Time secretarial help 
need for three month begin­
ning in December. Must be 
proficient with office equip­
ment. Apply in person, no 
phone calls. Young Waldrep 
4  Co., P.C., Certified Public 
Accountants, 1631 West 
American Blvd., Muleshoe. 
Texas 79347.
3-47s-3tc

............ .............. .
Job Overseas-Big money 
fast. $20,000 to 50,000 plus 
per year.
Call 1-216-453-3000. Ext. 
26047.
3-48s-2tsp

Satellite TV Antenna $48.00 
Complete Dealers Wanted. 
913-782-7879 Anytime. 
3-47t-2tcts

New Listing 
For Sale By Owner:

) Br, 1 Bath, 1 Car Garage. 
Central Heat, Comer Lot 
*riced to Sell.

402 E. Austin St. 
272-4738

IB-41 ttfc

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

KREBBS REAL ESTATE
il

If it’s Real Estate you! 
want, we have it or can getf 

lit.
H -Appraisals- a
I Tele. 272-3191-office and?
residence.

9. AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE I

FOR SALE: 1973 El Ca-' 
mino. 350 Engine, with' 
Headers, Mag Wheels, 
Need to Sell QUICKLY!! 
925-6761.
9-36s-tfc

FOR SALE: 1974 Cutlass, 
Call 272-5648 after 5 p.m. 
9-46t-4tc

11. FOR SALE 
OR TRADE

House for sale in Lenau 
Addition, Qualified buyer. 
Assume FHA Loan, 3 b.ed- 
room. 272-4956. 
ll-38s-tfc

15. MISCELLANEOUS 15. MISCELLANEOUS

J.B. SUDDERTH 
REALTY,INC. 

Drawer 887 
Farwell, Tx. 79325 
Ph. 806-481-3288

10. FARM EQUIP. I 
FOR SALE I

160 Acre on Hwy. N.W. 
of Muleshoe, 2 Wells, Ex­
cellent Financing. Priced 
for Immediate Sale.

320 Acre, 3-8 Inch Wells, 
1 Circle. Lays Excellent. 
Oklahoma Lane Area.

'20 Acre, 1 Circle, 2-8 
Inch Wells, Good Water 
Area. Oklahoma Lane 
Area.

A Very Nice 3 BR, I Vi 
Bath, House. Interior just 
painted. Central H&AC. 
Insulated, garage, incen- 
erator, corrals, and small 
feed shed. On small 7/10 
Acre, fenced, on Hwy. in 
Lariet. Only $20,000. 
Possible Owner Financ­
ing.
8-46s-tfc

FOR SALE: Avenger 3-
Wheel hoe hands with
spray tanks attached. Call
First National Bank.
272-4515.
i0-21t-tfc >- - ■«■»« «»»»«»»■■»»■
2390 Case Tractor, duals 
included. Case Warranty 
available. Estate must sell. 
Call 965-2731.
10-41s-tfc
1978 Model 2100 Lockwood 
Center Pivot Irrigation Sys­
tem. Call 272-5134. 
10-47s-5tc

ATTENTION 
All horseback riders that 
are interested in riding 
with a fun-loving, fam­
ily-oriented group are in­
vited to join us for re- 
freshements Thurs, Dec. 
1,7:00 p.m. at Lamb Co. 
Electric Co-op Building. 
South Loop, Littlefield. 
ll-47s-4tc

15. MISCELLANEOUS

WE BUY USED 
FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
15-5t-tfc

For Rent, One Bedroom un­
furnished apartment.
Call 965-2188 or 272-4754. 
5;45s-tfc..... . ................
Don’t throw your money 
away on Rent! Invest it in 
owheYs’fitp. Call Collect
Mark Bruns, A-l Mobile
Homes Lubbock; 763-5319. 
5-tfc-35t

I .... a  REAL ESTATt I
tOg SALE I

—...... ...................—.. . . . f...... -T'
FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
br, 2 bath brick home. 
Fireplace, carpeted garage. 
Beautiful yard & covered 
patio. Close to high school.

, 272-3402 or 272-3839. 
8-19s-tfc

FOR SALE OR LEASE: 2 
bedroom-den, living room, 
kitchen with fenced back 
yard. Call 272-3187. Good 
location, ‘/i block from 
Mary DeShazo School and 
Vi block from store.
8-41s-4tc

For Sale: 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
garage, new carpet, central 
heat, large lot. 272-4759 or 
272-4663.
8-46t-tfc

EXTRA* NICE3- l '/j-l ! new 
carpet, paneling through 
out. Screened in patio. Ca|L 
4541 or 5671 after 5:00 
p.m. Ask for Debby. 
8-13t-tfc

For Sale: 3 Bedroom, 2 bath 
fireplace, unfurnished Mo­
bile home 925-6773.
8-44t-tfc

Large 3 Bedroom, 2 bath, 
Country Kitchen, Living 
room. Den Celler under the 
house. $5,000.00 down, 
owner will carry. Call (806) 
381-9300 or 335-1880. 
8-46t-tjl

OFFERED BY OWNER: 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, brick 
house. Double living area, 
double garage, attractive 
features, 5 years old, 
assumable loan. Show by 
appointment, 902 Juniper. 
272-4317 or 272-4900. 

•8-47t-2tc

FOR SALE: 158 acres, new 
8 inch well. Underground 
tile. $134,000 South of 
Springlake. 257-3466. Larry 
McMillan.
8-48s-4tc

TOWN and

COUNTRY
Real Estate

***
Moderately priced 2 bed­
room with l'/i bath has 
R.V. shed in rear also 2 
extra rooms for offices 
or bedrooms.

Enjoy family life to the 
fullest in this large 2 bed- 
room-2 bath-2 car garage 
on large lot. Priced right.

••••
Affordabel 3 •''■’room 1 
bath, and
large d J jM ui nreplace.

If you are tired of waiting 
for your broker to sell 
your place, try us.
2 phone numbers 
272-5335 days, 272-4307 
nights and weekends.

•••

PLACE YOUR LISTINGS 
WHERE THE ACTION 
IS! CALL US.

John W. Smith 
Broker 

806-272-5335 
223 East Ave. B 

Muleshoe, Tx 79347 
8-48s-stfc

JIMMIE CRAWFORD 
REAL ESTATE & INS. 

1725 W Ave E 
Muleshoe, Texas 
Phone 272-3666

3-2 with carport in Rich­
land Hills. Very nice.

3-1 Vi-2 with carport in 
Lenau Addition. Well 
kept.

3-1-1 with storage barn 
on 3 acres west of town.

2-2 Trailer House with 4 
lots at Progress.

154 acres west of town 
with 4 wells. All waters. 
160 acres west of town 
with 2 wells. Good price.

320 acres N.E. of town 
with 3 wells. Good land.

6 apartments • all rent­
ed.

Need listings on dryland. 
8-41s-stfc

9. AUTOMOBILES 
* FOR SALE

For Sale: 1980 Chevrolet Vi 
ton Pickup. 4 speed. 4 wheel 
drive. Air and other extras, 
Call 272-4515 from 8 a.m. to 
5 p.m.
9-44s-tfc

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

BINGHAM & NIEMAN REALTY 
116 E. Ave. C 

272-5285—-272-5286

ENJOY COUNTRY LIV- (could be converted to 3rd
ING in this 3-1 3/4-2 bdrm.), large utility &
home on 1 acre with nice sprinkler system
large patio. Cent. A&H, .....
built ins, fenced yard, 3-1 +  1 carport home on
storm shelter, fruit trees, corner lot, nice carpet,
& more!!!!! fenced yard, & more.....

DON’T MISS THIS 3-2 3-1-1+ 1 carport, work &
home on 1 acre, isolated storage area, utility room,
master bdrm., Cent. fenced yard!!!!
A&H, built ins, fireplace, .....
wet bar, built-in gun cabi- BEAUTIFULLY LAND-
net, fenced yard, & isula- SCAPED 2-2-2 Brick,
ted storage......  built in, Cent. A&H, fire-

__  place, sprinkler system,
EARTH 3-1 3/4-2 Brick, & much more.....
isolated master bdrm., —
Cent. A&H, built-ins, RICHLAND HILLS
fireplace, nice finished 3-2-2 Carport Brick, Cent,
basement, fenced yard, A&H, built ins, 2 fire-
storage bldg. & only 4 places, nice den, & much
yrs. old!!!! more!!!!!

A STEAL AT ONLY 3-1% Brick home, built
$20,000 is this 3-1 +  1 car- 'ns. fireplace, nice car­
port home, Cent, heat, pets, fenced yard. A very
fenced yard, new roof, nice home in an excellent
and more......  location. Priced to Sell...

EXTRA NICE 2-1 +  1 car- NICE COUNTRY GRO-
port home, freshly paint- CERY-plus 2-1-1 home,
ed inside & out, fenced large barn, all on 1 acre,
yard, & storage bldg.!!!!! & located on Fm.-Mkt.

.....  Crossroads. $40,000!!!!!
COUNTRY CLUB-3-1 %-2
Brick. Cent. A&H, built CLOVIS HWY. -3-1 home 
ins, fenced yard, storage & 2-1 home (rented) on 
bldg. A nice, quiet neigh- approx. 4.4 acres, fenced, 
borhood & has sprinkler system.

Only $42,500.......
2- 1-1 home on comer lot, —
freshly painted interior, HORSEMAN'S DELIGHT
includes furniture & other ‘3-1 home on 5 acres plus 
items. One block to school horse barn with all utilit-

__  ies, training arenas, &
3- l% -l carport, large other barns. $37,500!!!!!
master bedroom, nice ...........
workshop & storage 2-1% Mobile Home +2
bldgs. Low 30’s.... carport, built ins, cable

.....  TV, plus large bam &
3-144-2 home on comer corrals on 2 acres, on
lot, Cent. A&H, built ins, pavement close to tow n-
covered patio, fenced .....
yard. Buy Equity & 3-1-1 home on 3 acres.
Assume!!!!! with Ford Tractor &

Equip. $39,500!!!!!
3-1 Vi-1 Brick, near ......
schools & Hosp., fenced On pavement at the edge 
yard, nice large work- town, approx. 2000 sq. 
shop. Only $39,500. ft- Brick, partially finish-

.....  ed on 32 acres with 6”
3-1% home on comer lot, weh- P*us 36’ x %  metal
built ins, Cent. A&H, is- hldg......
olated master bdrm., ......
utility, and much more. 3-1 %-l carport Brick,
$42,000!!!!! Cent. A&H. built ins,

.....  storage area, fenced yard,
3-2-2 carport on 1 acre, on corner iot!!!!!
built ins, workshop area, ......
storage bldg., 2 travel CHURCH BLDG, on 2
trailer hookups. Edge of l°ts. approx. 2350 sq. ft.,
Town..  Paved parking.....

LENAU ADD. FARMS
JUST LISTED-Very Nice 1062 acres, 3 wells, 2
4 bedrm.-2 bath home, circle sprinklers, large
completely remodeled. tnetal barn. 9% Owner
Cent. A&H, built ins, Financing......
fireplace, microwave. ......
Jenn-Air, utility, office. 80 acres, 6” well, under-
Small Equity & Assume... tile, close to town....

JUST LISTED 2-1-1 acres, 8” well under­
home, Cent, heat, fenced 8rd- l'ne< & sideroll
yard, & much more!!!! sprinkler......

VERY NICE 2-2-2 Brick w e also have a good
home, Cent. A&H, built selection of other farms,
ins. loads of storage, din- commercial property, &
ing room, den, Iv. room l°ts- Check with us for

details on these listings! 11

“ WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS”

GEORGE NIEMAN, BROKER 
DIANNE NIEMAN\ BROKER

$2000 REWARD 
For the arrest and conviction of person(s) responsible for 
putting dirt in the crank case of two spreader trucks 
parked at Bovina Feeders, Inc. on or before 10-30-83. 
Call: B.L. Martinez at 364-8315, or 825-2103 or 481-3303. 
15-45s-lmc

15. MISCELLANEOUS

ALEX’S TIRE SERVICE 
For service 24 hour* a day 
telephone 272-5012 or Mo­
bile 965-2242. 224 East
Fourth Street, Muleshoe, 
Tx. 79347.
15-5s-stfc

Bruce & Matthews Inc. Re­
frigeration & Electrical 
Contractor’s, Heating, Cool­
ing, Appliance Service. 424 
N. First, 272-5114.
15-44t-tfc

Need some one to take over 
payments of $144.85 on a 3 
bedroom 2 bath 14 x 70 
Mobile Home.
Call 806-763-9281.
15-47s-4tc

Firewood-Order Now for 
your Oak Firewood.
272-3987 After 6:00 Any 
Time on Sat. or Sun. 
Wayne.
15-38t-tfc

For Sale: Used Olympia In­
ternational Omega 303 copy 
Machine. Clean and in good 
condition, Asking $500.00. 
Contact King Grain Co. 
272-4541.
15-46s-tfc

Ceramic Shop For Sale: 
Thriving Business. All 
Molds, pouring tables, 
shelves, kilns and paint 
supplies. 272-4143 or 272- 
5027.
tltc-45s-tfc

OPENINGS in Registered 
Child Care Home. Call 
272-3222.
15-34t-tfc

HONEY FOR SALE

Nick Landers
334 W. Ave. J. 

272-30%
/5-5t-tfc
HOME REPAIRS. F.M. 
Saldana Construction. Lic­

ensed and bonded plumber: 
Specialize in cement, car­
penter work, remodeling, 
painting, acoustical ceil­
ings. 272-4955 
15-16s-tfc

One lot for Rent for a 
Mobile Home. Completely 
plumbed and wired.
Call 272-3718.
15-47t-3tc

PARTY MINTS
$5.00 per 100 - Christmas, 
Showers, Parties and Spec­
ial Occasions, Place orders 
after 4:00 at 272-5074. 
15-47s-6tc

YE’OLE GARAGE SALE 
across from Dairy 
Queen. Used clothing, 
inventory changes. Odds 
& ends, coming & going 
daily. New items & used 
ones. No Million Dollar 
Deals. Just one million 
dollar deals • Come see 
Us!
James & Wanda Kemp
15-38s-tfc

DAVIS
COMMERCIAL

PUMPING
SERVICE

Cess Pools Grease Pits 
Dipping Vats Mud Pits 

Septic Tanks 
" If it's part liquid A not 
over 20 ft. deep we 'll try 
to drain it. ’*

806-272-4673 
806-272-3467 

Muleshoe, Texas 
15-38s-stfc

MEN AND WOMEN
1 7 - 6 2

TRAIN NOW FOR 
CIVIL SERVICE 

EXAMS
No High School Necessary 
Positions Start As High As

$ 1 0  -21 HOUR
• POST OFFICE • CLERICAL
• MECHANICS • INSPECTORS

KEEP PRESENT JOS WHILE 
PREPARING AT HOME FOR 

GOVERNMENT EXAMS

Writ* S Include Phone No. To:

National Training 
Service, Inc.

% Muleshoe 
Publishing Co.
P.O. Box 449 

Muleshoe, T xas 79347 
15-47t-4tptts

16. LIVESTOCK

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

A m e r i c a n

^ V a l l e y/ NVESTMENTS 1
REALTORS

}  WE BUILD NEW HOMES!!! J

+ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ * ★ ★ * ★ * ★ ***+ + + + + + + + ******»
JUST LISTED-Large 3 Bedroom, 1 3/4 Bath, 2 Car 
Garage Brick Home. Located on 1 Acre Goae to Town. 
Approximately 2600 sq. ft. Lots of Storage. Cable. Large 
Fenced Yard.

COUNTRY HOME---3 B»*' , 1 Bath, 1 Car Garage
located on app rox ir^ i )Vj»C.es Northwest of Mule­
shoe. Fruit Trees an ^V kpe Vineyard.

BUILDER SAYS SELL!!!—3 Bedroom, 1 3/4 Bath, 2 car 
Garage. Fireplace. Cathedral Beamed Den.

280 Acres in Lazbuddie Area- Electric Valley 
Sprinkler-2 Siderolls 1-8” Well 1-6“ Well, 3/4 Mile 
Underground PVC, 1/4 Minerals, 25hp. Lake Pump, 32 
Acres of Improved Grasses.
PRICED TO SELL!

LOVELY CORNER LOT-Extra Nice 3 Bedroom, 1 3/4 
Bath, Carport. Isolated Master Bedroom. Carpet like 
new. Lots of Storage. Good Location.

SUPER SHARP-3 Bedroom, 1 Bath, Single Car Garage 
with Workshop. Enclosed Patio. Paved area in back for 
Recreational Vehicles. Well-Kept Yards.

GOOD RENT PROPERTY-2 Bedroom and 1 Bedroom 
Homes. In Good Condition. $22,500.00.

3 BEDROOM-1 Bath, Single Car Garage. Separate 
Dining Room. $20,000.00. V

COUNTRY LIVING-2 Bedroom, 1 Bath, Double Car 
Garage, Basement. Located on Approximately '/a Acre. 
$14,000.00.
LARGE BUILDING in Back for Workshop, Storage, or 
Hobbies. 3 Bedroom, 1 Bath Home in Lenau Addition.

Light Calves and yrls. for 
sale will contact back for 
spring deliver. Check our 
prices

TOM COFFEE 
806-665-1439 or 

806-665-3504 
16-47s-6tpts

18. LEGAL NOTICES |

The MULESHOE INDE­
PENDENT SCHOOL DIS­
TRICT is accepting bids for 
one metal bui'ding 70' x 
130’. Seated bids must be 
received no later than 7:30 
p.m. on Monday, December 
12, 1983. Plans and speci­
fications are available from 
Tom Jimks, Muleshoe I.S.D. 
Buisness Office, 514 West 
Avenue G., Muleshoe, Tex­
as, 79347. Bids will be open­
ed during the regular meet­
ing December 12, 1983, 7:30 
p.m. at the School Business 
Office.

The Trustees of the Mule­
shoe Independent School 
District reserve the right to 
reject any and all bids and 
waive all formalities in the 
best interest of the District. 
18-47s-3tsc

18 LEGAL NOTICES

2 BEDROOM-1 Bath, Den, Utility Room. New Plumb­
ing. Close to Park. $13,000.00

PRICE REDUCED TO SELL-Nice. Well-Built 2 Bed­
room, 1 Bath, Single-Car Garage. Storage Building.

GOOD STARTER HOME-1 Bedroom Home. Priced at
only $9,500.00.

3 BEDROOM-1 Bath, Carport, Close to Hospital.
$20,000.00

2 BEDROOM-Home at only $15,000.00.

LARGE FENCED YARD-3 Bedroom, 1 Bath, Good Roof. 
New Plumbing. Close to Hospital. $17,000.00.

272-4266

Derrell Matthews— 965-2127 
Thursie Reid—-272-3142 
Karen Harris—-272-5183 
Lucille Harp—-272-4693 

Rex Harris ^Broker JohnJL^fl^Jluilder^

8-43s-stfc

Ordinance No. 243 
An Ordinance by the City 
Council of the City of Mule­
shoe, Texas, amending Sec­
tion 9-7 of the Muleshoe 
City Code, 1974.

Now Therefore be it or­
dained by the City Council 
of the City of Muleshoe, 
Texas:
SECTION 9-7. Fees for use 
of City disposal area.

(a) The following fees 
shall be charged for use of 
the City garbage and trash 
disposal area:

(1) Pickup trucks or trail­
ers having a capacity of two
cubic yards or less.......$5.00
per load

(2) Trucks or trailers hav­
ing a capacity of between
two and six cubic yards-----
$10.00 per load

(3) Trucks or trailers hav­
ing a greater capacity than
six cubic yards-----  $15.00
per load

(b) The only persons exe­
mpt from charges for use of 
garbage disposal area shall 
be householders disposing 
of garbage and trash from 
his own family unit on which 
there is a sanitation charge 
currently being paid. 
PASSED AND APPROVED 
THIS THE 22 DAY OF 
NOVEMBER, 1983.

Charles Bratcher 
Mayor, City of Muleshoe 

ATTEST:
Mary Hicks
City Secretary, City of Mule­
shoe
18-47t-ltc


