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High School Graduation Set, 
Honor Students Designated
Commencement exercises 

for 42 Clarendon High School 
seniors will be held Friday 
evening, May 23, in the 
Harried Sisters Fine Arts 
Center at Clarendon College.

The program is slated to 
begin at 8 p.m.

•S Baccauaureate for the 
senior class will be held 
Sunday, May 18, at the same 
location, also at 8 p.m.

Kim Horton, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Barney Horton 
o f  Clarendon, has been 
named Valedictorian for the 
1975 graduating class. 
During the past four years, 
Kim has averaged 95.53 in 
all her school work.

Named as the Salutatorian 
-was Wayne Hardin, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Homer Hardin. 
Hardin has averaged 94.76 
throughout his high school 
career.

Also named as honor 
graduates, each averaging at 
least 90.00 on all grades for 
the past four yours include 
Jeanie Barbee, 92.98; Jake 
H ightower, 91.54; Danny 
M onroe, 90.68; Carolyn 
Shaw, 90.66; and David 
Butler 90.07.

Final exams for Clarendon 
High School are slated for 
Thursday and Friday, May 
22 and 23. School will 
dismiss for the summer at 
the end o f final exams.

Students will pick up report 
cards on May 28, between 9 
and 10 a.m.

Ninth grade Junior High 
School students will be 
honored on an awards day

exercise to be held at the 
school auditorium on Friday, 
May 23, at 1 p.m. where 
outstanding students will be 
recognized for their school 
work.

Stina Cain, Junior High 
School Principal, said Tues­
day 63 ninth grade students 
will be entering high school 
in the fall term from the 
present class.

Clarendon College Class 
Will Graduate Friday Night

Forty-two candidates will 
be presented for graduation 
at Clarendon College Friday 
night. May 9.

The graduation will be 
held in the Harned Sisters 
Fine Arts Center o f 
Clarendon College at 8:30 
p.m . A reception for 
graduates and families will 
be held at 7:30 p.m. in the 
College Cafeteria prior to the 
graduation exercises.

Mr. Mike Boothe o f 
Clarendon and son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Melvin Boothe will 
give the Valedictory address.
Boothe will graguate with a 

perfect 4.0 grade point 
average and receive an 
Associate in Arts Degree.

Miss Amy Lemley, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Troy 
Lemley o f Hedley, will 
present the salutatory ad­
dress.

Presentation of awards will

C of C Golf Tourney 
Draws Strong Field

The team of David Parker 
and John Zett of Amarillo 
fought a strong wind Sunday 
afternoon at Clarendon 
Country Club while putting 
together a team low-ball total 
o f 63 to take first place in the 
championship flight of the 
Clarendon Chamber o f 
Commerce partnership golf 
tournament.

Parker and Zett came from 
behind after having a 
low-ball score of 66 Saturday, 
two behind three other teams 
which each |.^>ted low-ball

scores of 64 in the first 18 
holes of play.

Eddie Duenkel and Max 
Hickey o f Pampa were 
second with a total of 130 
strokes for 36 holes . Duenkel 
and Hickey were tied for the 
lead with a score of 64 
Saturday evening but fell two 
strokes back Sunday after­
noon.

Dick Weston and Marvin 
Dick Jr., both of Amarillo, 
won a sudden death play-off

Con’ t on Page 2

be made by Beryl Clinton, 
Dean o f Clarendon College. 
President Kenneth Vaughan 
will make the presentation o f 
diplomas to the graduates.

The 1975 Graduates are:
Associate in Arts; Lisa A. 

Abram, Estelline, Mike 
Boothe, Clarendon, John 
Burson, Silverton, Joe 
Evans, Abernathy, Bruce 
Wayne,'Turkey, Frank Grif­
fin. Grover, John Holland, 
Clarendon, Anthony King, 
Clarendon. Amy Lemley, 
Hedley, Delbert McWhorter, 
W heeler. Donald May, 
Estelline, Katrina Messer, 
Clarendon, Larry Mitchell, 
M uleshoe, Janie Morris, 
Estelline, Eddie Noel Potts, 
Estelline, Joel Ross, Quail, 
Rickey D. Seigler, Paducah, 
Wanda Trout, Clarendon, 
Leigh Vaughan, Shamrock, 
Jess Wall, Perryton, Billy 
Dean White, Childress.

Associate in Arts and 
Associate in Applied 
Science: Joe Thomas Chil­
dress.

Associate in Science: 
Harrison Andrews, Phila­
d e lp h ia , P en n sy lvan ia , 
Lynita G. Brown, Groom, Jon 
Cartwright, Amarillo, Cindy 
Chilton, Hedley, William 
Delaney, Vista, California, 
Nolan Duncan. Amarillo, 
Mark Gentry, M em phis, 
Mary Attn Gilbreth, Antoni- 
to, Colorado, Barry Long, 
W ellington, Cindy M yers, 
Clarendon, Melody Parker, 
McLean. Judy Carol Peters, 
W ellington, Mary Plain, 
Follett, Sandy Poteet, Pan­
handle, Lillian Ralston, 
Spearman, Mary Elena 
Roma. W ellington, Elgin

Arthritis Forum Slated 
Tonight at College Cafeteria

The Panhandle Divison of 
the Arthritis Foundation, 
West Texas Chapter, will 
present a public forum 
Thursday. May 8. at 7:30 
p.m. at the Clarendon Junior 
College Cafeteria.

The forum is a part of the 
foundation’s public service 
program to make people 
aware of arthritis and what 
can be done to treat the most 
common ailment. A similar 
forum held in Amarillo last 
week drew an attendance of 
over 800 persons.

Mrs. Carolyn Hamilton of 
Clarendon will open the 
meeting and give the general 
introduct ions.

Stated to appear Thursday

night on the program will be 
Dr. Charles Seward, internist 
with Collagen Disease 
Speciality of Amarillo, who 
will speak to the assembly on 
the diagnosis and threatment 
of arthritis; Dr. Don Leon 
Fong, Orthopedic surgeon of 
Amarillo, who will discuss 
surgical management of 
arthritis victims, and Gilbert 
Gimbel, chief physical thera­
pist at St. Anthony’ s 
Hospital in Amarillo, who 
will discuss the role of 
physical therapy in the 
management of arthritis.

Dr. R.L. Gilkey of 
Clarendon will introduce the 
guest doctors.

Ralph Bauder, president of

the Panhandle division, will 
inform the audience of the 
Arthritis Foundation and 
what it does for the people it 
serves. Later in the 
program, Bauder will also 
discuss arthritis quackery. A 
question and answer discus­
sion period will permit the 
audience to ask questions 
and receive answers from 
doctors present on the 
program.
of the Amarillo branch of the 
Arthritis Foundation, will 
give the closing remarks to 
the program.

Clyde Skinner of Colorado 
Springs, Colorada spent a 
few days last week with his 
sister Inez Skinner.

Sledge, Dalhart, Juanita 
Young, Wellington.

Associate in Applied 
Science: Gus Havens, Clar­
endon, Frank Jackson, Clar­
endon.

Amtrack
Service
Sought

A delegation from Claren­
don will be flying to Ft. 
Worth on May 15 to join 
other interested citizens from 
neighboring towns located on 
the Burlington North Rail­
road lines in an effort to 
secure Amtrack service 
between Dallas and Denver.

ICC hearings will begin on 
that date to decide on the 
routing of Amtrack service to 
either Denver or El Paso. 
The Clarendon delegation 
has been allotted 15 minutes 
on the matter to state 
reasons why service to this 
area would be advantageous.

According to the proposed 
route from Dallas to Denver, 
,ailroad passenger service 
would be established in 
entermediate points all along 
the route, including Claren­
don, for a trial period o f six 
months. At the end of the 
trial period, passenger 
boardings would be analyzed 
and a determination made by 
Amtrack for continued ser­
vice to each town involved.

The move is being headed 
by Walt Knorpp, president of 
the Clarendon Chamber of 
Com m erce. Other board 
members of the Chamber 
will also attend the hearings 
as a part of the official 
delegation appearing in favor 
of the Dallas-Denver routing.

Other cities which will also 
appear at the hearings 
include Wichita Falls, Chil­
dress, Memphis and Ama 
rillo, plus numerous other 
smaller towns, all advocating 
the establishment o f the 
Dallas to Denver route.

Any interested citizen who 
would like to appear at the 
ICC hearing should contact 
Knorpp. Arrangements are 
being made for three 
airplanes to make the 
one-day trip.

Bennie Reese of Clarendon 
received the Football Hustle 
Award at Howard Payne 
University in Brownwood 
April 28 during an assembly 
in Mims Auditorium.

Sandra Mooring, a representative of the board of directors for the Clarendon Chamber of Commerce, presented H.G. Bobbitt a 
$50 cash prize Firday for winning the bass and walleye division for April in the Chamber sponsored fishing rodeo at Greenbelt 
Lake. Bobbit won the first month's prize money on the last day of the month with a five-pound, 14-ounce bass. His April catch 
will automatically be included as a grand prize entry at the end of the rodeo which could earn him an additional $150.

Chief of Police Submits Letter 
Of Resignation Tuesday Night

In a surprising move 
Tuesday night. Chief o f 
Police Gary Gerdes present­
ed the Board o f City 
Aldermen with a letter of 
resignation, asking that it be 
made effective Sunday, May 
20 .

Gerdes said he will be 
accepting the duties as 
juvenile and misdemeanor 
probation officer for Swisher 
and Castro Counties effective 
May 20, and although he will 
miss working with law 
enforcem ent directly, will 
still have connections with 
law enforcement agencies in 
the Panhandle area.

Gerdes has been police 
chief in Clarendon for the 
past 10 years, coming here 
from Canyon where he was 
with the security department 
o f W est Texas State 
University. Prior to his 
association with the WTU 
security department, Gerdes 
had been deputy sheriff for 
Swisher County on two 
different occasions, totalling 
four years service.

In his letter of resignation 
to the Board of Aldermen, 
Gerdes states "I respectively 
submit and ask for your 
acceptance my resignation as 
Chief of Police, effective May 
20, 1975.

“ My reasons are few, but 1 
feel that I will have more 
spare time, other fringe 
benefits such as retirement 
pay and an increase in 
salary.

“ I will be accepting the 
duties of being probation 
officer for the counties of 
Swisher and Castro. The 
decision did not come easily.
I have given ten years of 
service to the City o f 
Garendon, wanting only in 
return the best for the 
department, city and you 
(the Board of Aldermen). It 
has been mv honor to have 
served you and the people of

Car Stolen 
At Jail

Clarendon. 1 shall remember 
it as one of the greatest and 
rewarding experiences of my
life.”

In a statement for The 
Press, City Administrator 
Bud Knorpp said that he was 
sorry that Gerdes was 
leaving but that he felt it was 
in every way a promotion for 
Gerdes and that it would not 
be right to try to hold him.

"Gerdes gave us 10 years 
of good, solid police work 
and a whole lot of loyalty. 
This he will leave with us, 
and we are mucli T>ettef off 
for his having passed this 
way. We all wish him the 
best,”  Knorpp said.

Following the acceptance 
o f G erdes’ resignation, 
Aldermen agreed to begin 
accepting applications for a 
replacement, recommending 
than the person hired should 
have a minimum of five years 
in law enforcement work, be 
a certified law enforcement 
officer and hold at least an 
intermediate certificate.

The city has hired a new 
patrolman for the police 
department to help with the 
manpower shortage which 
has now developed. Steve 
Rogers Jr., 24 year old 
Clarendon native, began 
work for the department 
Monday, May 5.

Rogers has already at­
tended the Panhandle Re­
gional Law Enforcement 
Academ y, at his own 
expense, and completed the 
required 240 hours of basic 
training as a law enforce­
ment officer.

He has served three years 
in the United States Army 
and is presently working on 
his associate degree in law 
enforcem ent at Clarendon 
College.

In other board matters, 
aldermen voiced approval for 
enforcem ent o f present 
zoning regulations pertain­
ing to the location of mobile 
homes in the R-l zones. 
Present regulations prohibit 
the location of mobile homes 
anywhere within the boundr- 
ies south of Third Street from 
Jefferson Street west to the 
city limits. Trailers may be 
put in any other part of town 
with this exception according 
to the present ordinances.

Also brought up along the 
same lines was the discus­
sion of allowing the erection 
of a steel building in the 
downtown fire zone area and 
aldermen agreed that pre­
sent ordinances provided 
against such construction.

City employees also re­
ported that the city sewer 
plant is getting a great deal 
of used motor oil injected 
into the sewer lines about 
twice a week from a local 
source and killing away 
enzymes at the city sewer 
treatment plant.

Homer Holman said this 
additional cost of enzymes is 
about $65 per week each time 
this happens. The City of 
Clarendon presently pays 
$3.95 per pound for these 
necessary bacteria to treat 
sewage and six to eight 
pounds must be added to the 
treatment tanks when oil is

found.
In addition, Holman said, 

employees have to scoop the 
oil and muck out with shovels 
in order to get the plant back 
in operation. Aldermen 
agreed that this additional 
cost to the city will have to be 
stopped at once.

Alderm en backed the 
proposal that city employees 
begin a search for the source 
of the oil by checking all 
service stations and garage 
grease traps and inspection 
of all systems for signs of oil 
overflow into the city’s sewer 
systems.

In the event this should 
fail, the city will call in the 
State Health Department for 
further assistance and strict 
enforcement of health de­
partment laws.

Pot Fine 
Levied to 
Amarillo Man

Julian Lee Burns, 27, of 
Amarillo, was fined $150 
plus $47 court costs by 
County Judge Billie Christal 
over the weekend. Burns 
was stopped by Police Chief 
Gary Gerdes on, a routine 
traffic check and a search of a 
vehicle being driven by 
Burns revealed a small 
quantity of marijuana.

Burns was charged with 
possession of less than two 
ounces of the weed and 
arrested for the offense

Area ministers were treated to an earlv momine breakfast and a tour of the Lakeview Watershed by the Donley County Soil and 
Water Conservation District Tuesday morning. The delegation had a look at all o f the sites and structures presently under 
construction for flood control lakes in the L a k e v ie w  Watershed. Monte Sowers (standing in door of bus) conducted the guided
tour for the ministers.

Thieves are getting a 
little more brazen all the 
time. The Donley County 
Sheriffs Office is investigat­
ing the theft o f a 1964 
Chevrolet sedan which had 
been parked beside the 
Donley County Jail.

The car is owned by Mrs. 
Alma Bain. According to law 
enforcem ent officers, the, 
automobile had been parked 
beside the jail for some time 
during the owners absense 
and was noticed missing 
Thursday by County Judge 
Billie Christal. S h eriffs  
officers said the car was 
locked and the keys to the 
vehicle were kept in the jail.

Deputies theorized the 
vehicle was stolen sometime 
during the night Wednesday, 
April 30. Only four nights 
earlier, two Amarillo men 
were arrested after allegedly 
stealing tires and wheels 
from another car parked 
behind the jail.

A new ttf>* record for lisilh iin  N o  was set Saturday by J.D. Bennett of 3115 Julian in 
Amarillo with this armfull of meanness. Bennett caught the fish while plugging for baas on 
Lake Greenbelt. The Pike weighed in at 17 pounds, six-ounces to set a new state record in the 
closed (caught on rod and reel) division: The old state record was 13-pounds, four-ounces held 
by Clarence Hamilton and was also caught on Lake Greenbelt.
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Chamberlain! Go,fTourn°y
by MRS. HAWLEY HARRISON

Mrs. Ethel Fowler o f 
Memphis visited Tuesday 
with her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
J.D. Jones Sr.

Mrs. Hawley Harrison 
attended the come and go 
shower for Freda White with 
Mrs. Loretta Harrison and 
Anna was delighted to see so 
many friends, especially 
Mrs. Velma Heathington and 
Mrs. Mary Dell Cleaver of 
Tulia. The shower was in the 
home o f Mrs. Minnie 
Cannon.

Mrs. Ruby Jewel Hardin 
had surgery last Wednesday 
and is doing real good.

Mrs. Ruby Blackman 
returned home from Pampa 
Saturday. She was missed at 
the Center Friday night.

We had a good crowd at 
Chamberlain Center Friday 
night. Mrs. Pauline Koontz 
and Mrs. Mary Lee Noble 
were our Hostesses and we 
had a wonderful time 
visiting, playing 42 and 84.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Dingier visited in Amarillo 
Sunday with her son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gilbert Mann, and 
Sheryl and Mrs. Myrtle 
Cowan and his daughters 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Cosper 
and Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Grimland, and Mrs. Ruby 
Jewel Hardin in Northwest 
Texas Hospital.

Mr. Wayne Lowe was 
home for the weekend with 
his mother, Mrs. Genoah 
Lowe.

Mr. Roy Thomason o f 
Wellington visited his bro­
ther, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Thomason, Thursday.

Mrs. Elba Ballew £nd son, 
Jack, visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald Ballew Friday.

The m essage Lt. Col. 
Arthur W. Burer, former 
Prisoner of War, brought on 
Faith was an inspiring one. 
No one knows the horrors our 
young people have endured. 
He spoke at Amarillo First 
Baptist Church Sunday 
morning.__________________

ness.

Remember

Supplies the energy- 
but only YOU can 

use it wisely!

Reddy's helpful 
tips for your
Dishwasher

% 1 ihshu asher mil usually hold a uhole day's dishes. It
hikes as much hot water and energy to wash I dish as it 
does o full load Stack your dishes out o f  sight in your 
dishwasher and wait until you have a full load to turn it

| I se onl\ detergents manufactured specifically for dish• 
u ushers. A wetting agent helps prevent water spots on
glasses and silverware

0  (.lean the filter screen often. A clogged filter can reduce
the efficient ) of your dishwasher.

Pick up your FREE copy of 
ENERGY CONSERVATION" 
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West lexas Utilities
C om pany

for third place from the team 
svid Moo

Hawley and Dennis Harri­
son were in Lubbock 
Thursday afternoon on busi-

Mr. Richard Stotts visited 
Sunday afternoon with Mr. 
and Mrs. Dennis Harrison.

M rs. Grace Ayres is 
visiting relative in New 
Mexico. We missed her at 
the Center Friday night.

Ron Dolman was expected 
to be back in the states from 
his tour o f duty in the 
Phillipines.

o f David Mooring, Claren­
don, and Gary Beddingfield 
o f  Panhandle after three 
additional holes o f play. 
Both teams finished the 
tournament after 36 holes 
with identical low-ball scores 
of 131.

Tex Welch o f Clarendon 
and Robert Mills o f Childress 
took top honors in the first
flight competition, shooting 

i o f 68 Saturd

Mr. and M rs. Henry 
Hastey visited Monday night 
with Mr. and Mrs. Otto
Elliott.

Marcy Helms spent 
Friday night with her grand 
parents Mr. and Mrs. D.R. 
Koontz, and Barbara and 
Paula Helms picked her up 
Saturday afternoon.

Mr. Olace Hicks went to 
Peoria, Illinois on business 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. D.R. Koontz 
spent Thursday night in 
Amarillo with Mr. and Mrs. 
James Morgan and Jason.

Dennis Harrison and Anna 
attended singing at the L.A. 
Watson home Friday night.

Mrs. Ruby Hamilton, Mrs. 
Louise Long and Mrs. Lois 
Lair o f Hedley visited Mr. 
and Mrs. D.R. Koontz 
Saturday.

Cliff Budd visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Otto Elliott Saturday.

Wanda and Dude Cornell 
and children visited Mr. and 
Mrs Otto Elliott Sunday.

A group o f young people of 
Martin Baptist Church 
attended k Barbecue cook out 
at Jack and Sue Leeper’ s 
after church services Sunday 
night.

Mr. and Othel Elliott 
visited Tuesday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Otto Elliott.

Mrs. Shirley Ivey returned 
home from visiting relatives 
in California W ednesday 
morning. Everyone will be 
glad to have her home again.

scores of bB Saturday and 67 
Sunday for a 135 total after 
36 holes o f play. Buddy 
Saunders and John Franklin 
of Panhandle were one stroke 
back with 136 to earn second 
place. Finishing in third 
place were Milton Kasch and 
Joe McMurray with a 138 
total.

In second flight competi- 
Johrtion, Bob Selman and John 

Sidlow o f Amarillo turned in 
a two day total score o f 140 to 
take first place in that flight 
while Bill Allison and Don 
Rosenback of Pampa carded 
a 36 hole score o f 142 for 
second place. Third place 
winners in the second flight 
were Doug Coffey and James 
Daugherty with 143 strokes 
over two day’ s play.

In third flight competition, 
Don Brittain and Ken 
Clements o f Amarillo took 
top honors with a 147. Larry 
Ripple and Buddy Karr of 
Gaude won second with 148 
total and B.J. Jordan and 
Ralph Collinsworth won a 
sudden death play-off from 
Bill Durham and Jay Towe to 
win third place in the third 
flight.

Both teams had recorded 
152 totals through 36 holes o f 
play. Jordon and Collins­
worth notched out their 
competitors on the 38th hole.

The first tournament 
sponsored by the Chamber of 
Commerce had a total o f 42 
teams entered, most of them 
from out o f town clubs.

All players were treated to 
noon buffet luncheons on 
both days o f the tournament, 
served in the dining room of 
the Clarendon Country Gub.

Community
A c t i o n
C a n t o r
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FFA  Personality-

Paul Hermesmeyer 
Is Star Farmer

Jaycee Club Chartered
In Clarendon, Begins

Paul Herm esm eyer, 16- 
year-old son o f Mr. and Mrs. 
Bud Hermesmeyer o f Gar- 
endon has been awarded the
Star Chapter Farmer degree 

■ict FFAin both local and district I 
competition with other out­
standing FFA students. 
Hermesmeyer will compete 
on the area level for further 
honors, and possibly later in 
state competition.

The title Star Chapter 
Farmer covers a wide span of 
FFA work, both with home 
projects and classwork. Both 
come under close supervision 
o fa g  instructors as well as 
parents, and generally is 
accorded to the highest 
individual in the class with 
the best performance.

Paul is the youngest of 
four brothers, with two older 
brothers, Frank and John, 
currently teaching agricul­
ture classes at Wall and 
Dumas. Another brother, 
Henry, works for Santa Fe 
Railroad in W oodward, 
Oklahoma. A younger sister, 
Mary Jo, is a student at 
Clarendon Junior High.

Paul’s interest in farming 
and ranching activities had 
an early beginning when he 
joined the Donley County 
4-H Club seven years ago at 
the minimum age of nine. 
He began raising cattle and 
hogs to show in livestock 
shows locally and at 
Amarillo, Fort Worth and 
Houston.

cate to purchase a Shorthorn 
heifer in the calf scramble 
and began a transition to 
switching breeds of animals.

Paul exhibited his first 
Shorthorn in March o f this 
year at Houston, winning 
second in his class. He has 
added to his stable o f  
Shorthorns since getting the 
first heifer provided by Pipe 
Distributors, Inc., o f Hous­
ton in addition to returning a 
heifer ca lf to the calf 
scramble this year.

He now owns two heifers 
and a Shorthorn bull 
purchased from  Ronnie 
Gooch recently.

In addition ty working with 
his animals, Paul also helps 
his father during the summer 
and after school on their 112 
acre stock farm where they 
raise hay for stock cattle. 
Paul says his ambition is to 
continue studying agricul­
ture throughout high school 
and college, and perhaps 
becom e a teacher after 
finishing college.

The new Clarendon 
' Jaycees were chartered April 
23,1975. Anyone between 18 
and 35 is urged to join now 
that we have the charter. 
Join and help the community 
grow along with us. W e plan 
on doing a lot o f things and 
have our sights set 

Clarendon Jaycees 
meeting Tuesday, May 6, 
and decided to build a new 
fence around the Little 
League baseball field. The 
fence will be constructed of 
4x8 sign board on which 
advertisements will be sold. 
The signs will be 4 foot high 
and in lengths o f 8 foot 
variables. All persons will be 
approached to purchase one. 
Help support the Little 
League and the new

Garendon Jaycees.
The Jaycees are • 

non-profit organization and 
will be doing various things 
in the future for the 
community or needy indivi­
duals.

Dr. Hudson presented a
clinic on his own technique of 
rebuilding tooth roots after 
trauma or disease has 
distroyed the tooth crown. 
Root canals, a core, and a 
dowel are used to save the 
root portion o f the tooth. A 
gold crown is then designed, 
and no extraction is

D r. Hudson
Named Finalist 
For Cooley Award

necessary.
Dr. Hudson won the grand 

prize at the Dallas Midwinter 
Dental M eeting with the 
same clinic. Dr. Hudson is 
the son o f Mr. and Mrs. 
W.O. Hudson o f Garendon. 
He now resides in Saginaw.

Dr. Keith Hudson, for­
merly o f  Clarendon was 
recently named as one o f the 
top four finalists for the 
Cooley Award at the Texas 
State Dental Meeting in Ft. 
Worth. The Cooley Award is 
given annually to innovators 
in the field o f dentistry.

The Texas Highway Com­
mission today approved 
construction of two addition­
al lanes, a safety rest area 
and frontage roads on 
Interstate Highway 40 in 
Donley and Gray Counties.

The work will extend from 
Alan reed southwestward to 
0.6 mile east o f Jericho, a 
distance o f  9 .7  m iles.

MRu> Welty of She
last Friday from Gi 

.with good catches

6 o iig w !|ta Ii< m A

Over 250 visitor 
the com munity a 
sponsored bv I< 
Chapter o f  the 
Society at Clarent
lege, April 21-25. 

lhe  large turnout

Children Visit
Lake McClellan

During the past seven 
years, he has shown animals 
at between 100 and 200 
shows, winning a fair share 
o f  prizes with various 
animals.

During his freshman year 
o f school (last year) he began 
his FFA work by raising 
Hereford cattle to show and 
market at different livestock 
shows throughout the state. 
While attending the Houston 
Fat Stock Show in March, 
1974, he received a certifi-

These children are the 
school bus passengers o f 
Mrs.Jess Finley. Last Friday 
afternoon, after school was 
turned out, they were treated 
to a short visit at Lake 
McClellan by their bus 
driver. Since the Lake was 
on the bus route there was no 
delay or problems concern­
ing the children getting 
home since all the parents 
knew and agreed that it was 
o.k. with them. Needless to 
say they had a most 
wonderful tim e. The 
children are as follows: Left 
to right: Rhonda Alley, 
Karen Wilson, Sam Stubbs, 
Robin Stubbs, Brenda Wil­
son, Theron Stubbs, and 
Scott Stubbs. The two small 
Children in the very front 
are: Traci and Billie Beck.

10 THE WINNERS 
off Door Friz** At our Rocont 

75th Anniversary Sal* •••

M rs. Hugh Sanders
Winner of Portable Color TV

\. a
' t  I

A D I

•  M rs. Helen Regers M A I

H f l i M i i  ntf r i l l  f a n  i l f l i  ■■■ ■vvinntr u i 919  w in M rancuve
THIl

CLARENDON OFFICE SUPPLY

The Day Care Center 
Board will sponsor bake sales 
on May 10th at Junior’ s and 
Gifford’ s Grocery stores. 
There will be a ' wide 
assortment of cakes, pies, 
and breads. The unique 
feature o f these bake sales is 
that one can make a special 
order ahead of time. If you 
are planning a Birthday 
party, Tea, -Bridge party, 
etc., and need a cake or pie, 
call the Community Actior 
Center at 874-2573 and place 
your order before May 8th.

Complete Printing Sarvlc*

(All Kinds)

Office Supplies and Furniture

On* Stop Dues H A ll
Quality & Service

M r. and Mrs. G.W. Estlack
Phone 874-2043104 S. Kearney

Garendon, Texas

•  M rs. E. H. Clark
W iaaor of $50“  G ift Certificate

i < t

WE HOPE YOU ENJOY THESE SIFTS S1

i  DOG
sJrooD

All

nr, ■ - r w —r

Fox worth Oalbroath
Shurfine Ligfi

IBrot
Lumber Co. I  Paper Hap

':i

|A&W

IRootB
Lucky Leaf
j Cherry P I*

Grade “ A ”

Chevrolet's Newest L ittle  Luxury Cur
J  Wilsons’ All 

1 Vienna Si

Monza Town* Coup*
I Chi net Extrf 
Paper Pit

See It  Teday A t

A LD ER S O N  C H EV R O LET

Bes-Pak

Plastic Fi
8 - 1 / 2 1

Spam

i t The Friendly Place le  Trade
ITexize

•> i Glass
Glass & Ap[ 
22 Oz. Spra)



\
on his own technique of 
lding tooth roots after 
na or disease has 
>yed the tooth crown, 
canals, a core, and a 

1 are used to save the 
portion o f the tooth. A 
crown is then designed, 

no extraction is 
isary.
. Hudson won the grand 
at the Dallas Midwinter 

tal M eeting with the 
; clinic. Dr. Hudson is 
son of Mr. and Mrs.
. Hudson o f Clarendon. 
iow resides in Saginaw.

le Texas Highway Cotn- 
tion today approved 
traction of two addition- 
nes, a safety rest area 

frontage roads on 
rstate Highway 40 in 
ley and Gray Counties, 
ic work will extend from 
treed south westward to 
mile east o f Jericho, a 
ance o f  9 .7 m iles.

Mfce Wetty of
last Friday from Greenbelt Lake.
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Ladies Golf Association

■aed with his catch o f an eight-pound, two ounce bass taken 
The fishing during last week provided numerous fishermen

with good catches including one 17 pound blue cat caught last Saturday.

Hr

Over 250 visitors viewed 
the com munity art show 
sponsored bv Iota Phi 
Chapter o f  the Honors 
Society at Clarendon Col­
lege. April 21-25.

lhe large turnout was due

i#r
to the high quality o f the art 
displayed. More than thirty 
exhibits were presented to 
the viewers. Paintings, 
macrame’ , a doll collection, a 
straight razor collection .

needlepoint work, a railroad 
nail collection , and ink 
drawings were only a few of 
the many things displayed.

A bake sale was held two 
days o f the art show.

Mary Sawyer and Mary 
Hudgins tied for medalist 
honors of the championship 
flight of the Women’ s Golf 
Association play day on 
Tuesday. May 1. Play day 
winner o f the championship 
flight was Billie Chauveaux.

First flight medalist was 
Sandi Wallace. Nell Barnhill 
was the playday winner.

The second flight also 
wound up in a tie for 
m edalist honors between 
Carole Karr Vnd Evelyn 
Moore, with Carolyn Payne 
taking winning slot for the 
play day in that flight.

M edalist for the third 
flight was Irene Gerner and 
Frances McClellan was tops 
in the play day.

Pairings slated for the 
WGA play day to be held 
May 15 for low putts on the 
back nine holes will be:

1. Susan Addy, Bonnie 
Gooch, Boo Lowe and Kaye 
White.

2. Nell Barnhill. Glen 
G reene, Joy Martin and 
Billie Chauveaux.

3. Avis Benson, Maxine

Hardin, Melinda McAnear 
and Carolyn Payne.

4. Dorothy Breedlove, 
Betty McCracken and Mable 
Dean Porter.

5. Kathryn Cain, Deen 
Hood, Sue Mclvers and Mary 
Ann Sawyer.

6. Betty Palmer, Mary 
Hudgins, Kaye White and 
Nancy Shelton.

7. Alice Courtney, Evelyn 
Moore and Frances Skelton.

8. Frances Deyhle, Donna 
Knorpp, Carole Karr and 
Melba Vaughan.

9. Jane Gilkey, Dorothy 
Knorpp and Sandi Wallace.

10. Zenna Belle Ginn, 
Peggy Minkley, Neita Mos­
ley and Sherry Welch.

Those visiting Mrs. Dewey 
Goodman and Chris, Monday 
night was her sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. Buster Vaughn o f 
Lubbock. Her brother Mr. 
and Mrs. Clyde Barker of 
Turlock, California, her son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Good­
man, two neices Nova Lee 
M ooring and Viola and 
Doyce Graham.

Fun After 50
On last Saturday the Fun 

after fifty Club met at the 
Lions Hah.

Games o f 42 and dominoes 
were played.

The meeting opened, with 
Lords Prayer read in unison 
lead by Mr. Watson. The 
president presided over the 
business session. Secretary 
and Treasurer report was 
given.

For the program Mike and 
Judy McCully gave a few of 
their organ and piano 
numbers which everyone 
enjoyed very much.

Mrs. Bill M ontogom ery 
won the door prize. Recogni­
tion o f birthday cards in May 
were presented to those who 
had them.

All the men were honort d 
with a red crrnation 
boutineer.

Prizes were given to the 
oldest people. They were 
O .C . W atson, Mrs. Paul 
Shelton and Mrs. Florence 
Hester.

We did not get to have the 
style show. A trip was 
planned for June the 25th to 
Canyon to see the Texan by 
bus.

At the noon hour Mrs. 
Tucker gave the grace. A 
lovely dinner was served. 
The tables looked pretty with 
their flower decorations. 
About (43 members were 
present.) The dub welcomed 
two new members, Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Humphries.

FT A Installs 
New Officers 
Tuesday Night

Tuesday night, April 29, at 
7:30 in ,the high school 
cafeteria, the local Future 
Teachers of America held 
installations for the 1975-76 
FT A officers.

The program was under 
the direction o f chapter 
president, Mac Thornberry. 
Mary McGarity said the 
invocation and Bubba New- 
house led the pledge. Next, 
Kim Horton led the pledge of 
the Future Teachers o f 
America. Mac Thornberry 
then gave the highlights of 
the FT A year. Installation of 
the new officers came next 
with Shirley Wise redting 
the qualifications o f the new 
officers. Those installed as

1975-75 officers were: Mac 
Thornberry. President; Mark 
Boothe, Vice President; 
Paula Hardin, Recording 
Secretary; Jan Barbee, 
Financial Secretary; Ralph 
McGarity, Parlimentarian; 
Mona Robinson, Historian; 
Karen Burgess, Correspond­
ing Secretary; and Miss 
Betty Veach, Adviser.

Miss Veach. FT A Adviser, 
concluded the program by 
presenting gifts to two FT A 
Honor Seniors members. 
Those who. received the 

I recognition were Kimspecial i 
Hortonlorton and Jennie Barbee.

All FT A members and 
their guests were served 
refreshments consisting of 
chips, dips, and punch.

A p p r o x im a t e ly  30 
attended.

Kimbra Anderson com­
peted in the United Playday 
May 4, 1975. This was the 
first playday held for the 
1975 season. The playday 
was held at the Rolling Hills 
Arena in Amarillo. 
Kim competed in all ten 
games. She placed sixth in 
barrels, poles and rescue. 
Kim and Christel Atchley 
placed first in ribbon race 
and second in two man relay.

AD EFFECTIVE 

M AY 7,8,9,10

T H IM -

Shurfresh All Meat

FRANKS
Vacuum Pack

SE SIFTS

eath

Doa Food IT *  Liquid 
n Rev”  $1„  |Dotorgont

$109

Vi or, w t Ro 'Sk ? f v '3P Sn5f r  v r f« *  rvT ^ ?  15 :
Shurfine Light

Brown Sugar
Boxes

Paper Napkins

USDA Grade"A”

Turkeys
All Sizes 9 m

Carnation '
m  Chunk
I  l i n n  Style Light

Folgers All Grinds

Coffee
Curity Daytime 30
Disposable Diapers cnt Pk9

Clifford Grocery
I)O l m  K STAM I’S K\ K in  11 E S \ ) \ \

.„  J GROUND BEEF Lean All Beef
Can |  Ground Fresh Daily

s o i ’ l
2 lb can

$198

I Lb.

Laundry Detergent

Lipton .

Tea Bags 100 cnt pkg

Carnation Non Fat
Instant Dry M ilk 14 Quart Pkg.

Dream Whip 3 1 /2  oz pkg

USDA Grade “ A "

Fryers

$ 1 5 9 1  Cudahy Chuck Wagon

BACON

Lb

2 lb pkg

Wrights Dry Cured

.  Dream Whip 3 112 oz pkg
A&W  6  16 Oz. $ | 39

Root Boor Bottles 1 Dessert Topping 39c
u ................................................. ............................................................. ............................................................................
Lucky Leaf m  e t r  ; : Bakers’

Hams Shank 1/2 or Whole

Butt 1/2

lb

$105 lb

Lucky Leaf
I Cherry Pie Filling

|Grade " A ” Large

Eggs
#2 Can j Chocolate Chips 12 oz pkg. ......... •

Shurfresh Pure.............

0 1 0 0  Vegetable Quartered ^  2 lb- I f

SUPER

Doz
M i

$100
Wilsons’ All meat

I Vienna Saasage 3 cans

Chinet Extra Heavy

Paper Plates 40 cnt Pkg * 1 19

Bes-Pak
Plastic Freezer Boxes q j t c

8 - 1 12 pint containers

Spam

12 oz can

Texize

Blass Plus
Glass & Appliance Cleaner _  
22 Oz. Spray Bottle or 32 Oz Refill

Bake-Rite 3 Lb. Can

Shortening
American Beauty g oz 
Instant Potatoes pkgs 3 for *

Del Monte
Tomato Sauce Sozcans 3 for 

Del Monte
Tomote Juke 46 02 can

Colorado 
White Russett

SAVINGS f i

Potatoes 10 lb Bag

Florida

Oranges Sweet and
Juicy 5 lb Bag

g  California

wam.a.. a -8 02 79* I  S traw berriesVanilla Wafers Pkgs. "  *  |

Mayzola

Ne Stick
"For Greaseless Aero Can

F ry in g " |

Florida Golden Sweet

Com
Large Full ears

3 for

13 Oz. $119
<\ern  P a n  • 49*

Arizona

Lettuce
Box I  Large firm heads each

f
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James Gray (daughter of the 
Bernon B erry's). The 
envelopes were paid for by 
Mrs. Berry and postage for 
letters over 200 was paid by 
Mrs. James Dunn.

The response has been 
extra good so far and we are 
hoping other contributions 
will soon com plete our 
estimated needs.

Mrs. James Dunn, 
Chairman 

Howardwick Bicentennial 
Committee

Howardwick
Bicentennial
The Howardwick BiCen

tennial Committee is pleased 
to report the following 
names and amount o f eacl 
donor to the fund drive: 
J.W. Hartwick 25.01
W .M. Corgill 32.0(
John A. Sarich 25.0<
Howardwick Lions

Club 200.0(
James W. Dunn 25.0<
Mrs. R.M.

Bradley 25.01
Mills, Family 15.0<
Vernon Berry 20.01
Glen Doty 50.01
Mr. and Mrs. L.L.

Morris 20.01
E. R. Castner 50.01
B.B. Winkles 25.01
H.C. Taylor -  5.0
Mrs. Ann Bolin 20.0
M.O. Burns 10.0
Leroy Durham 10.0
A.J. Mitchell 10.0
Doil Douthitt 50.0
Mrs. Lena Howard 25.0
Charlotte Clark 15.0
Mrs. T.C. Faver 5.0
Roy Clark 25.0
George Howard 50.0
George Arrington 25.0
F. W . Seweatt 5.0
R.E. Newell 50.0
R.F. Ewing 5.0
Gary Watson__________ 10.0

Ashtola-M artin
MRS. HUBERT RHOADES

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Roehr 
and children o f  Silverton 
recently visited their parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Chet Roehr 
and Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Lane.

Sorry to report Mrs. Ruby 
Jewel Hardin had surgery at 
St. Anthonys Hospital in 
Amarillo and is recovering 
nicely at this time.

Visiting Mrs. T.A. Nelson 
W ednesday evening was 
M rs. Lena Howard Mrs. 
Norma Corgill and Mrs. Cora 
Bland of Howardwick.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyce 
Graham recenty spent the 
week end with his brother 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Graham and others at 
Halfway.

Mr. and Mrs. B.H. Clay 
made a business trip to 
Panhandle and visited her 
parents Mr. and Mrs. L.M. 
Porter in Claude.

Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Bible 
and Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Rhoades attended the con­
cert presented by Vicki and 
Royal Heirs Gospel Singers 
at the First Baptist Church 
Tuesday night in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Grady 
Nelson and son Arthur Gene 
of Schulenburg came Thurs­
day for a few days visit with 
Mrs. T.A. Nelson and sister 
Mr. and Mrs. John Just of 
Lelia Lake.

visited Saturday with his 
mother Mr. Ollie Nelson and 
sister Eudora Joyner.

Joan Chamberlin o f Ama­
rillo came and picked up 
Jason Green. They spent the 
weekend with her parents, 
Mr. and M rs. Gordon 
Chamberlin in Panhandle.

Mrs. Rosilee Lockwood df 
Amarillo visited Wednesday 
with Mrs. Skeet Brown.

Joe David afcd Brenda 
Turner of Lake Tanglewood 
and Janie Hall o f Clarendon 
visited their grand parents 
Mr. and Mrs J .B . Lane 
Saturday.

Mrs. Bill Bennett was in 
Amarillo Saturday with the 
Lonnie Parr family. Keith 
needed her at the track meet 
and later at his 7th birthday 
party.

Joe Wheeler Edna Watt 
David Martin Lane and Judy 
Adams attended the college 
rodeo in Clarendon Friday 
night.

Mrs. Ester Mahaffey of 
Dumas visited Wednesday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. H.S. 
Mahaffey and on Thursday 
Mr. and M rs. Bright 
Newhouse and Mrs. Mahaf­
fey went to Honey Grove, 
Texas for the funeral services 
of Sam Newhouse, Ester’ s 
brother and Bright's Uncle. 
Our prayers and sympathy 
go to this family.

Terry Bible, Christie and 
Brad o f Pampa visited 
Saturday with Mr..and Mrs. 
Clovis Bible. Terry went 
fishing, Christie and Brad 
stayed with their grand 
parents.

Mr. and Mrs. Gale Gray 
and Ronnie spent the week 
end in Dallas with her sister 
who contiues to improve.

Mr. and Mrs. Nuford Dill 
were in M em phis on 
business Thursday.

Those having dinner 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
John Just at Lelia Lake were 
Mr. and Mrs. Grady Nelson 
and Arthur Gene o f Schulen­
burg, Frankie Just o f Ama­
rillo. Mr. arid Mrs. Harvie 
Dunn o f Pampa and Mrs. 
T.A. Nelson.

Bill Bennett's son Jimmy 
and grand daughter Rhonda 
of Amarillo visited Bill Satur­
day.

Mrs. Larry Green and Lori 
spent Sunday in Panhandle 
with her family. The Gordon 
Chamberlins and brought 
Jason home with them.

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Hall 
Jeff and Todd o f Amarillo 
stopped by their grand 
mother Nelson’ s home Sun­
day evening enroute home 
from Dallas.

Mrs. Terry Bible picked up 
Christie and Brad Saturday 
night. They were spending 
the night with her mother 
Mrs. Bolin in Hedley.

Mr. and Mrs. W .A. Ward 
of Memphis visited Sunday 
with Mr. and Mr. J.R . 
Graham and boys.

Larry Green had lunch 
Sunday with his parents Mr. 
and Mrs. Horace Green.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Sarpalius o f Boys Ranch 
visited Sunday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. J.R. 
Graham and boys.

Mrs. Frankie Green o f 
Umbarger stopped by the 
Horace Greens Sunday 
afternoon enroute home from 
Oklahoma.

Mr. and Mrs. Grady 
Nelson and Arthur Gene left 
Monday for their home in 
Schulenburg.

Bumice Porter and James 
of Skellytown visited Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. B.H. 
Clay.

B.F. Debord had coffee 
with Mrs. Hubert Rhoades 
Monday morning.

Odom made a business trip 
to Hale Center on Tuesday.

Mrs. Chris Weems, Kyle 
and Kristia o f  Amarillo 
visited Wednesday with Mr. 
and Mrs. L.O. Christie.

Faylon Watson of Houston 
spent the week end with his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. L.A. 
Watson and others.

Mr. and M rs. Charlie 
Hearn had their children Mr. 
and Mrs. Mickey Thomas 
and children Thursday and 
Friday.

Mr. and M rs. Steve 
Reynolds and Wayne were 
with Mr. and Mrs. L.A. 
Watson for visiting and ice 
cream Thursday night.

Friday afternoon Mr. and 
Mrs. Othel Elliott visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Glynn Helton.

Those visiting Friday night 
in the L.A. Watson home 
were, Bro. and Mrs. Charlie 
Gloyd, Tracy and Pattie, Mr. 
and Mrs. Steve Reynolds and 
Wayne, Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
White and Tammy, Mr. and 
Mrs. Govis Bible, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Lee per, Bryan and 
Scharla, Dennis Harrison 
and Anna, Mr. and Mrs. Olis 
Hicks and Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Watson and Regena.

Mr. and Mrs. Buddy 
Brunson, Mike and Lori o f 
Amarillo spent the week end 
with their parents Mr. and 
mrs. Othel Elliott.

We are so sorry to report 
Mrs. Lloyd Risleys brother 
Wayne L. Johnston o f San 
Diego, California is in the 
hospital under going tests at 
this time.

Lloyd Risley made a 
business trip to Lubbock 
Friday.

Mr. and M rs. Buddy 
Brunson and children and 
Mr. and Mrs. Othel Elliott 
attended the College Rodeo 
Saturday night and went to 
the Darrel Leffew home for 
visiting afterwords.

Mrs. Charlie Hearn’ s 
cousin, Emil Chesser o f 
Texhoma, Oklahoma, and 
Frank Lyle visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Charlie Hearn Saturday 
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Risley 
attended the supper and 42 
party at Chamberlid Friday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete 
Easterling o f  Clarendon 
played 42 with Mr. and Mrs. 
Glynn Helton Saturday 
night.

Mrs. L.A. Watson reports 
she has her garden planted. 
This reporter does not think 
she planted in the right sign, 
some people do plant in the 
ground though.

Mr. and Mrs. L.V. Risley 
o f Clarendon visited Satur­
day night with his parents 
Mr. and Mrs. LLoyd Risley.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tolbert 
and children o f  Pampa 
visited Sunday with his 
parents Mr. and Mrs Robert 
Tolbert.

Those enjoying a cook out 
at Greenbelt Lake Saturday 
as guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
L.A. Watson were: Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Cole, Terry, Tim 
and Shanna, Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Watson and Regina, 
Faylon Watson and Mr. and 
Mrs. Steve Reynolds.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Hearn visited Saturday 
evening with Bro. and Mrs. 
Floyd.

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Lyles 
went to St. Anthony’ s 
Hospital in Amarillo Sunday 
afternoon to visit Mrs. Ruby 
Jewel Hardin.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Tolbert made a business trip 
to Amarillo Sunday.

Lamce Gardner 
Candicate for Graduation

Larnce E. Gardner, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Willie Gardner 
o f  300 N. Martindale, 
Garendon, is a candicate for 
graduation at McMurry 
College in Abilene, Texas.

He is due to receive a B.S. 
degree in Phys. Ed. at 
commencement exercises at 
3 p.m. on Sunday, May 3, in 
the J .W . Junt Physical 
Education Center on the 
McMurry campus. .

Larnce is a 1967 graduate 
of Garendon High School. 
His minor is speech.

h ra u  jacks, corrugated

cases o f flourescant bulbs,

Total to date S832.00
The placards placed in 

store windows were made,

Gid for and distributed by 
rs. WUI Corgill.
Two hundred thirty letters 

were mailed to property 
owners having meter con­
nections. The letters were 
m em eographed and the 
stationery furnished by Mrs.

ores, doors, kerosene stove, 
picket fencing, make-up 
table, skewer doer, conck, 
chairs, school desks and
chairs, bed frame, flower bed 
siding, pictures, cellulite

O.M. Talley died Monday 
night after a lengthy illness. 
Mr. Talley is the grand 
father o f Mary Green. 
Funeral services were held in 
Dodson Thursday afternoon. 
Our sympathy to the family.

M rs. Beth Payne and 
Charlotte and Mrs. Horace 
Green visited Monday with 
Mrs. Larry Green and 
children.

Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Bible 
made a business trip to 
Amarillo W ednesday and 
had lunch with her sister 
Mrs. Wendol Cumbie.

Mr. and Mrs. Nuford Dill 
visited Monday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd 
Reid in Claude.

Mrs. Ben Lovell was on the 
sick list at this time.

Mrs. Ethel Reid had 
arrived home Monday from 
High Plains Baptist Hospital 
to recuperate for a few days 
before more surgery is 
scheduled.

Mr. and Mrs. Doss Finley 
returned home from 
Clarkesville Wednesday, his 
brother Mr. and Mrs. Fate 
Finley came home with 
them.

Mr. and Mrs. BUI Wise announce the engagement and i _
Julie to Earl Hartman son of Mr. and Mrs. Leon Hartman

approching marriage o f their daughter 
an of Wellington. The marriage vows 

will be exchanged at the First Baptist Church in Clarendon on Thursday July 24, at 7:00 p.m. All 
friends of the couple are cordially invited to attend. Miss Wise is a graduate o f Clarendon High 
School and is how attending Garendon College.' Mr. Hartman graduated from Wellington High 
School and is presently attending Clarendon College. The couple is planning to make their 
home in Plainview where they will both attend Wayland Baptist College.

Junior High Choir 
Bake Sale

The Clarendon Junior 
High Choir is having a bake 
sale on Saturday, May 10,
1975 beginning at 9:30 a.m. 
at Spier’ s and Barbara's 
Fabric Mart. Pies, cakes, 
cookies and other goodies 
will be for sale. We would 
appreciate your support.

'Texas' Slates 
Grand Opening

The Gala Opening of the 
musical drama, “ Texas”  in 
the Palo Duro Canyon on 
June 18, 1975 will be the 
occasion for the third art

Grass Drills Fur Rmrt

Jay Gould
Bm  *7  Mm m  S74-3S01 N iflrti 

AN Kinds Of Grass Suud

competition sponsored by the 
drama and the Panhandle 
Plains Historical Museum. 
The subject for 1975 will be 
‘ ‘Openings’ '-.

The judges for the 
competition on the occasion 
o f the tenth season o f

“ Texas”  are being announ­
ced today: they are Olive 
Vandruff Bugbee of Garen­
don, art curator o f  the 
Museum; Garence Kincaid 
o f  Lubbock, Texas, horn 
professor o f art at Texas 
Tech University.

BAILEY ESIES AND SON
WoMbm Fabricating

7.00%  hrtarast On Savings
Take Advantage of the Modem An unity.
•Interest la tax sheltered until withdrawn.
•Make deposits or withdrawals at any time. 
•Deposits can be withdrawn and the interest left b

MAURICE RISLEY, REPRESENTATIVE

Mr. and Mrs. R.R. Partain 
visited in Amarillo Tuesday 
afternoon with his mother 
Mrs. W.W . Jones, Mr. and 
Mrs. Raymond Walker his 
sister and Mrs. Willie Mills 
and boys,

Mrs. Hubert Rhoades 
attended the funeral services 
for Keith Swinburn Monday 
and helped with lunch for the 
family at the J.R. Brandon 
home. Mrs. Lillie Knox was 
also present.

Mrs. Dick Roehr and Deb 
of Silverton made a business 
trip to Groom Monday and 
stopped by the J.B. Lanes 
enroute home.

Govis Bible and Hubert 
Rhoades made a buiness trip 
to Wellington Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. J.R. Graham 
attended the funeral services 
for O.M. Talley in Dodson 
Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Fate Finley 
left Friday morning to spend 
the week end in Canyon and 
Amarillo with others of the 
family.

Week end guest in the 
Bemie Green home were 
K atherine's sister Susie 
Dunn and friends Ann 
Carrell and Jann Shaw of 
Texas Tech, Lubbock.

M rs. Harold Green o f 
Phillips visited Friday with 
her mother, at Medical 
Center enroute home she 
visited Hubert Rhoades.

Ellen Green spent Friday 
and Saturday night with 
Terri Sharks.

Mr. and Mrs. John Just of 
Lelia Lake had dinner 
Saturday with Mrs. T .A . 
Nelson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Nelson and Arthur 
Gene.

T.B. Nelson o f Amarillo

HOSE by Hanes & Flettomet

Give 
Mother 
a Gift 

Certificate

LUGGAGE by 
Up

SLACKS SETS $27 
$69.95

MARTIN NEWS
Tuesday morning Mrs. 

Dortha Reynolds, Mrs. Susie 
Floyd and Mrs. L.A. Watson 
went to Medical Center for a 
devotional period and visit­
ing.

Mrs. L.A. Watson visited 
Tuesday afternoon with Mrs. 
Otis Bohanon in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Hearn visited Monday after­
noon with Mrs. Clarence 
Moss in Garendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald

SHORT SETS $9.95 
$27.95

New
Furniture I

At Low Low PrlcesW p ^ W p n

We B u y * Sell
gS S gg rt Good Used

T&M General 
Store, Inc.
Clarendon, Texas 874*2162

GLOVES: All Calars, All 
Sixes, Short k  Long by 
Fownes From $2 to $$.

Clean and adjust •

* 1 0 »

“ Includes service call 
to Clarendon'’
All work guaranteed.

Bill Wuovur 
•04-883-5952

Box 757
White Deere, Texas 

79097
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b y  J E R R Y  S P A R K S
Back at the first of the year, the Clarendon Chamber pf

Commerce at its first official meeting, set forth some goals 
that were more than ambitious for the small budget which the 

(■ Chamber had allotted itself in serving the businesses of 
Donley County.

j | One of the principal areas of work for the 1975 year was in 
tourism and the exploitation of Donley County’s recreational 

f\s resources. We feel it is proper to dwell at some length on 
what has been accomplished in this area, with still more than 

’> half the year to work.
While working the Chamber’ s partnership golf tournament 

this past weekend, we heard a few criticisms of the two day 
affair. Most of these were directed toward the lack o f local 

,, participation in the tournament.
When plans for the tournament were beiiig formulated, the 

Chamber encouraged local participation, but directed plans 
for the tournament toward the higher classed out-of-town 
golfers who would patronize not only the Clarendon Country 
Club, but also the motels, service stations, restaurants and 
other businesses.

The Chamber cannot account for the amount of money 
A spent locally with downtown businesses during the weekend, 
| but more than $3,000 was spent locally on Saturday and 

| Sunday alone by the 54 people who entered and played in the 
■ tournament

, ••••

These dollars were not in circulation here last Friday, and 
members o f the board of directors feel that this is an 
accomplishment and will help in a small way to stimulate our 
economy.
tournament is held again, that will enhance the chances of 
making it better.

We heard lots o f good comments about the meals served 
the contestants Saturday and Sunday, and none of the golfers 
seemed the least bit shy about partaking o f goodies at the 
three refreshment stands set up at points along the course.

As a matter of fact, we can’t recall hearing any criticism 
from anyone except local people who were not entered in the 
tournament.

At any rate, the participants were all a cut above the 
average in all four flights, and the number of entries, 
although short of the origianal goal, was adequate. We 
noticed that Clarendon’ s tournament drew more entries than 
the Borger partnership tournament held the same weekend, 
and was about equal to a similar event being held over the 
weekend at Guymon, Oklahoma.

Fabricating
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Hiqhliqhtt 
Sidelights

by Lyndell Williams

AU STIN —  Major legislation 
bearing on property tax val­
ues throughout the State has 
been passed by the House and 
sent to the Senate.

Representatives approved 
two separate measures which 
some contend provide for 
“ the first major overhaul of 
the property tax structure in 
Texas this century.’*

HB 637 by Rep. Luther 
Jones o f El Paso establishes 
a legislative tax board which 
will conduct an $8 million 
statewide audit o f taxable 
property during the next two 
years.

HB 1463 by Rep. Wayne 
Peveto o f Orange would di­
rect all property tax ap­
praisals to be made by 
countywide offices. Local tax­
ing authorities would still 
establish their own tax rates 
and assessment ratios under 
the legislation.

The State Comptroller’s 
office would develop stand­
ards and procedures for the 
county tax appraisers.

Both bills are regarded as 
important to school finance 
reform. Many o f the school 
measures would base alloca­
tion o f state aid on market 
value o f district property.

VOTE BILLS ADVANCED

Bills important to the legis­
lative process cleared the 
House in a busy week.

force it.
SB 300, with a contro-| 

venial party purity amend-’ 
ment attached, provides for 
a -computer-policed perma­
nent voter registration sys­
tem. The measure returns to 
the Senate, which previously 
has rejected the “ purity”  
provision requiring voters 
to register by party prefer­
ence.

Other major bills passed 
by the House last week 
would provide for establish­
ment of Health Maintenance 
Organizations (SB 180) and 
encourage rape victims (HB 
284) to report crimes and aid 
prosecutors in getting con­
victions. x-The HMO bill went 
back to the Senate with a 
minor amendment and is ex­
pected soon to be signed into 
law.

LAWYERS CURBED

A State Bar o f Texas Com­
mittee on Professional Ethics 
has held city councilmen and 
mayors who are lawyers 
should not practice in mu­
nicipal courts or represent 
clients in cases initiated by 
city police officers.

Morris Hassell of Rusk, 
committee chairman, said 
some of the same reasoning 
used in the opinion could be 
applied to legislators prac­
ticing before state agencies.

COURTS SPEAKHB 4 revises the 1973 cam­
paign reporting and disclos­
ure act, and establishes a bi- A  State Supreme Court 
partisan commission to en- decision cast doubts on

cities’ rights to regulate tele­
phone rates for “ extended 
metropolitan area service.” 
The high court upheld an in­
termediate House court rind­
ing that a city has no inher­
ent power to regulate utility 
rates, but only that granted 
by the legislature.

The Supreme Court also 
affirmed a $189,194 damage 
judgment against a Houston 
finance firm following the 
death o f a man from a heart 
attack after efforts to collect 
a $158 debt.

In another case, the high 
court found no usury in a 
Dallas savings association’s 
$24,985 profit from arrang­
ing a $150,000 loan for a 
development firm.

AG OPINIONS
The legislature has author­

ity to require public utilities 
to refund to customers exces­
sive rates, Atty. Gen. John 
Hill held.

In other recent opinions, 
the Attorney General con­
cluded:

• A commissioners court 
is not required to call an 
election for purpose o f in­
validating previously-author­
ized road bends on presenta­
tion o f a petition.

• The legislature may alter 
the method of selecting mem­
bers of public service boards 
so long as the agencies’ eco­
nomic obligations are not 
impaired.

• A commissioners court’s 
mere refusal to ratify a prior 
action allegedly taken in vio­
lation o f the open meetings 
act does not o f itself have 
the effect of invalidating 
the earlier action.

APPOINTMENTS
R. Paul Teague Sr. o f 

Texas City was named by 
Gov. Dolph Briscoe to the 
College Coordinating Board, 
succeeding Loren Bryce 
Meaders o f Dallas who re­
signed. v ,

Briscoe appointed Michael 
P. Metcalf o f Dumas district 
judge o f the 69th district 
(Deaf Smith, Oldham, Moore, 
Hartley, Sherman and Dal­
lam counties).

He named Barry E. Black- 
well of Dalhart to succeed 
Metcalf as 69th district at­
torney.

Tom Cole o f Houston is 
new deputy general counsel 
for the Republican Party o f 
Texas.

Roy M. Talley o f Austin 
will serve on the legal com­
mittee o f the Interstate Oil 
Compact Commission for 
Texas.

SHORT SNORTS
The Governor entered into 

an agreement with the U.S. 
Department o f Labor allow­
ing unemployed Texans to 
receive an extension o f up 
to 13 weeks in unemploy­
ment benefits.

School Land Board an­
nounced bids will be received 
for a large oil and gas lease 
sale June 3. Another sale is 
scheduled at the same time 
for Texas Youth Council, 
Parks and Wildlife Depart­
ment and Department of 
Corrections lands.

The Senate passed a bill

to require coverage o f alco­
holism in health and accident 
insurance policies.

Students Hear 
Lecture

Recently a lecture con­
ducted by Mr. W.C. Taylor 
in his European History 
Class considered the socio­
political problems in North­
ern Ireland. The lecture led 
to an extensive dialogue 
among the students and their 

As a result Ms.

Amy Sue Lemley 
cated her opinions and 
concerns in a letter to British 
Prime Minister Lord Harold 
Willson. She received a 
lengthy personal reply from 
David Walker Fuat Secretary 
of the British Foreign Office 
Assigned to their Embassy at 
Washington D.C.

Included in the letter was 
the statement by Secretary 
Walker that he considered 
her conception o f the Ulster 
problem " T o  be a most 
perceptive analysis o f the 
situation."

GIFFORD HIU A CO
In, Texas Phene 983-5231 Night 963-5387

We have a complete line o f

■RKATIO N EQUIPMENT
Need a slderoB, bet den’t want to bay, lease

We also sell.and Us

Progi

In order to sonro you 
itottor f itotpitutlitg 
Jwno 1, wo w ill b ill 
your lo r throo months 

atim o, instoadol

CABLE I.V ,

Another area of work which has drawn attendlon from the 
Chamber of Commerce is Greenbelt Lake. Although the 
Chamber cannot take credit for the large number of people 
which visit the lake each week, there is some promotion going 
on in this area.

The fishing rodeo which began April 1 and will continue 
through July 5, is a project currently being underwritten by 
the organization, and has distributed a total of $125 in prize 
funds thus far. It has drawn entries from Amarillo, Pampa 
and other outlying areas and we do know that these people 
are not just one-time visitors to the lake.

No story travels faster than a good flsh.jst£ryvand the, 
directors know that fishermen go where the fish are-and* 
spend a great deal o f money doing it. This is the numbet one 
priority of the Chamber of Commerce...drawing outside 
money into our economy for circulation here.

•**

There are several other projects .currently in the mill 
including rolling out the red carpet for visitors during the 
Miss Texas Teen-Ager contest to be held here the last 
weekend in May. Although the Chamber has no official 
function for this contest, the national headquarters of the 
pageant has been contacted by the Chamber and word is 
being passed along to the parents of the more than 60 
entrants that Clarendon has an excellent golf course and a 
lake brimming full of fish if their interests lie in these 
directions.

Other attractions will help entertain parents during their 
brief stay in downtown Garendon, plus numerous people 
have been kind enough to donate their time to providing 
information centers for visitors.

The Chamber is also working to secure Amtrack service for 
Clarendon. This item is covered in another story appearing on 
the front page of today’s paper.

There are still other projects which are in the planning 
stages and will be announced later. As a footnote, we would 

ii like to add that all o f the above, and more, is being done with 
a budget of only $5,671 for the entire year.

Getting back to the Miss Texas Teen-Ager Pageant, we
received a telephone call from the national director, Mrs. 
Sybil Shaffer, last week and garnered some more tid-bits to 
pass along to our readers.

First and foremost, Mrs. Shaffer said, she had spent part o f 
the day Monday (April 28) visiting in the White House with 
President Ford. Although the visit was short and more of a 
courtesy than anything else, Mrs. Shaffer said President Ford 

« had just recently spoken with the head o f the United States 
Chamber of Commerce, a most powerful and persuasive 
organization in Washington.

The U. S. Chamber of Commerce has become infatuated 
with the them of the Miss National Teen-Ager Pageant and 
has adopted it for use during the Bicentennial year. The 
theme, of course, is ‘ ‘What’ s Right About America” .

* We informed Mrs. Shaffer that we are in the process of
adopting the theme ourselves for a special edition due to be 

j; printed about the middle of May ahd distributed to more than 
35,000 high school students and other readers throughout the

B Panhandle area.
The edition will be in tabloid form, using the colors of the 

pageant (red, white and blue) and will be distributed through 
high schools which go from near Lubbock north to the 

| Oklahoma border, and from the New Mexico border east as 
’  far as Vernon.

;  l This is an ambitious undertaking on our part and has 
blossomed from a bud of an idea. The edition will contain 
pictures and stories on outstanding students from most high 
schools throughout the Panhandle, as well as pictures and 
stories of all the contestants in the Miss'Texas Teen-Ager 
Pageant.

We have received calls from as far away as Oklahoma City 
for placement of advertising in this issue and we are very 
gratified at the reception so far.

Never before have so many birds been killed with one 
'j stone. It was originally designed to recognize the pageant.

|l Then we wanted to add the recognition of outstanding 
students...and decided to make this an observance of the 
Bicentennial kick-off as well.

Distribution will begin in Panhandle high schools on May 
19, and additional copies will be inserted in this paper on May 
22. _ _ _ _ _  _____________

t t l

Hallmark Gradaation Cards
100 Rexall 250 mgm

V i t a m i n  C  9 9 e
17 oz Jergen Moisturizing

| Body Foam m <

7 oz Aerosal
A ir Frashanar

$1.75 Smooth All-over

Body Lotion one ounce size
24 oz Aerosol
Glory
Rug cleaner

iaoroady Flash Light

89*

49 cents solid
Glado

3/
$|00

24 oz Super size

Kit
Car Cloanor Wax

TOOTHPASTE

$3.90 Intimate Perfumed

Body M oisturizor $ 1 9 5

Scope
19’s Economy Giiletts Pak Trac

Razor Blades
$ 1 2 9

16 oz Liquid

Spray P ain t

9 9 *

oz Twice at Nice

Shampoo
69 cents pro
Tooth Brash
Bamboo Pole
Fishing Ootflt

$2.99 Spice
Jar Sot

12 oz

M ylan ta
9’s S Shick
Sapor H Cartridgos

Pampers

30 Day tii

24 Extra Ahsorhont 
Daytimo

14 oz

Regard

T iin n  e ll
Bay 1

Bottio Sapor

Plonamins

Pharmac 1



THE CLARENDON PRESS, THURSDAY, May, 8, 1975

COUNTK
R E V I E W

R «g. U .S. Pal. O ff .

R E A O E R  A O S  T H IS  SE C TIO N  C O P Y R IQ H T E O  
1 9 7 4  B V  D E N N IS M. K A SU M . P R E P A R E O  BV 
C O M M U N IT Y  N EW SPAPER A SSO C IA T E S.

Carrol’s Texaco And Radiator Shop L »
Carrol Gardenhire-Owner

This first class station is 
located at 110 North 10th in 
Memphis, phone 259-3494, 
and features the well known 
texaco products. They also 
feature expert radiator repair 
and service.

Nothing is more aggravat­
ing than to drive into a 
service station and have to 
wait several minutes before 
the operators o f the station 
realize you are there. You

can be assured this will never 
occur here. They realize 
their customers are often in a 
hurry and they make it a 
special point to take care o f 
their needs just as quickly as 
possible.

This firm has enjoyed good 
business because they are on 
their toes and they handle 
the best grade o f products. 
You can depend on quick 
service and complete under­

standing o f the job. They 
don't have to be asked to 
check the oil and tires. 
These are some o f the many 
services that make up this 
first rate service station.

The drafters o f this 1975 
Review unhesitatingly sug­
gest to our readers that they 
make a point o f depending on 
this reliable service station 
for their auto service needs.

Messer Electric

The purpose o f a building 
is to protect us from the 
weather. Unless it protects 
us from the weather year 
around, it is not a modern 
building. In regards to year 
around air-conditioning, 
most o f us are living in 
houses or working in 
buildings not up with the 
modern times in which we 
live.

Specializing in Installation & Service of 
Servel Air Conditioners"

around Servel air condition­
ing. Let them furnish you a 
personal survey with all the 
pertinent facts and figures. 
See Messer Electric located

With a Servel year around 
air conditioner, you set the 
thermostat for either heating 
or cooling and >ou  have 
spring the whole year.

If you hav* a central 
furnace, you likely have half 
an aircdnditipnifig system 
already and do not realize it. 
Call today for art estimate of 
the low cost o f enjoying year

at 102 Boykin Drive in 
Memphis, phone 259-3329.

The writers of this 1975 
Review recommend this firm 
for their fine service and 
expert workmanship.

A and A Drilling Company
1/2  HP Sta-Rite Submergable Pumps Reg $268.00 

Now Only $157.00
Gaylen Ariola and Jimmy Bowns-Owners

The A And A Drilling 
Company located West of 
Memphis on Hwy. 256 phone 
259-3245 has been able to 
effectively find water at low 
cost in this area for several
years.

Drilling a good , long 
producing water well is not a 
jo.b for the amateur. The 
knowledge and experience 
behind this well driller will 
prove valuable after you note

that the wells he has drilled 
has produced for some time, 
there have been no cave-ins, 
and that large enough pipe 
was installed with a strong 
pump that provides the 
amount of water you need.

They use late model 
equipment and trained 
assistants who also under­
stand their work, and you can 
be assured that the job will 
be com] ‘

’* ««iK i-

time, at the least expense, 
and with the very smallest 
damage to your property.

The editors o f this 1975 
Review, make public our 
recommendation o f this well 
driller for his fine work, and 
suggest qur readers remem­
ber to contact the A And A 
Drilling Company whenever 
they need a good well at low 
cost.

«<
Ann’s Shoppe

Spring Selections of Dalton & Kenrob Now 20 per cent Off" 
Lois Ann Monzingo And Ann Cofer-Owners

Ann’s Shoppe is located at 
726 Main in Memphis, phone 
259-3109. Here they feature 
the latest styles in modern 
dress design. They carry a 
com plete line o f  ladies 
ready-to-wear, suitable for 
the college girl, business 
woman, or housewife. This 
shop caters to the discrimin­
ating women o f the section. 
They have kept right in step 
with the tastes o f the women

in this area, and carry some 
o f the finest brand names in 
women’s apparel. They also 
feature Life Stride, Miss 
America and Keds casual 
shoes.

In this shop you can find 
just the right accessories to 
complete your new outfit. 
Also they can show you an 
array o f sport clothes, pant 
suits, slacks, skirts and 
blouses you will like.

Depend upon them to furnish 
the clothes you will need. 
Whether it is a coat, suit, bag 
or dress, this is the shop 
where you will always find an 
exciting selection.

If you have not visited 
Ann’ s Shoppe you are 
cordially invited to do so.

The editors of this 1975 
Review make it our pleasure 
to recommend this fine store 
to all our readers.

J L’s Western Wear
G.W . and Janice Lockhart-Owners

In this age o f satellites, 
astronauts, and moon walks, 
there is still a great need in 
every community for a well 
stocked, reliable western 
wear store. In Memphis it is 
J L’ s Western Wear, located 
at 102 South 5th, phone 
259-2728. Here you will find 
western wear to suit every 
individual need. The ladies

and little ladies will find 
m o cca s in s , .b e l l -b o t t o m  
pants, western cut blouses, 
and accessories.

The men and boys will find 
boots, hats, shirts, jeans, 
jackejSf.and belts...all carry­
ing such famous western 
brand names.

Here you will find saddles 
built on the finest trees that 
can be obtained. They also

have bridles, halters, and 
many other items o f the 
finest grain leather.

W hether you are a 
rancher, stockman, rodeo 
hand or just a “ drug store 
cowboy” , the editors of this 
1975 Review suggest that it 
is to your advantage to drop 
in here soon and look over 
their large selection.

Pat’s Place
[Formerly Speedy’s Drive 

Pat and Dean Stewart-New
Good food and fast service gers and sandwiches, french

?SSare the by words o f Pat’ s 
Place located on Boykin 
Drive in M em phis phone 
259-2513. As many people in 
this area have found, there is 
no better drive in than this 
one.

fries, all types of cold drinks.

Ini
Owners
you fast service.

On their menu you will 
find taste tempting hambur-

and some o f the best desserts 
you ’ ve ever tasted, all 
prepared in the most sanitary 
conditions with modern 
equipment.

The management o f this 
drive-in has made it a point 
to hire employees who are 
courteous and who will give

The compilers of this 1975 
Review suggest to our 
readers that the next time 
they are in town, they stop in 
at Pat’s Place for a tasty 
filling meal at little cost. We 
compliment them for their 
reputation o f quality food 
and friendly service.

Memphis Upholstery
Eddie and Linda Gable-Owners

The Memphis Upholstery, 
at 7th and Brice in Memphis, 
phone 259-2026, enjoys an 
extensive patronage from 
this section because o f their 
fine business reputation. A 
large stock o f  beautiful 
furniture for every type home 
can be found in this well 
managed furniture store. 
Articles are offered at prices 
you can afford, with terms to 
suit you.

The manager offers the 
jst accommodating service 
d  will be glad to assist 
lyone in the selection of 
oper furniture. The idea

that it takes a fortune to 
furnish a home is not true. A 
man making an average, 
salary can furnish a home 
comfortably and completely 
if he will come to this store 
and consult them. They 
feature recliners by Burkline 
and Lazy Boy, sofa sleepers 
by Mastercraft and Flersteel, 
mattresses by Spring Air 
(Spring Air Bedding Com­
pany), Permalux sofas and 
stiites and Kay Chair 
Company'.

The Memphis Upholstery 
is a prominent establishment 
and the people in charge 
throughly understand the

business in which they are 
engaged.

It is both economical and 
wise to reupholster your 
furniture. If you are tired of 
the color scheme o f your 
rooms, you can easily change 
it by having your furniture 
upholstered by this firm to 
blend harmoniously with the 
colors and shades you wish to 
use. Here they have an 
excellent selection of fine 
fabric samples. t

Stylists
Today, more than ever 

before, a womans total image 
depends a great deal on her 
hair. Beautiful hair can 
make even the average 
woman look and feel 
exquisite.

In this area, women on the 
go, find the surroundings of 
the West Side Beauty Shop, 
located at 1402 Montgomery 
in M em phis, phone 
259-2717, the “ in”  place for 
hair styling to the “ Nth”  
degree.

You too, are sure to find 
this place the most progres­
sive hair styling salon to be 
found anywhere. Here you 
can relax, and unwind in

their pleasant atmosphere 
while professioilal hair styl­
ists show you the latest, 
up-to-date, scientific ap­
proach to beautifying your 
hair.

The hair stylists here are 
specialists in styling, cutting, 
tinting and waving as well as 
wig styling and total wig 
care. The personnel here 
have a passion for perfection 
and a flair for glamour.

We, the editing staff o f 
this 1975 Review emphati­
cally suggest that you enter a 
more exciting and beautiful 
world with a visit to the West 
Side Beauty Shop. We know 
you’ ll be glad you did.

Deep Rock Service Station
Clarence Neel-Owner

If you are particular about 
your car, then you should be 
particular about your car’ s 
servicing. People through­
out this area will go out of 
their way to stop in at the 
Deep Rock Service Station, 
because they know that these 
friendly attendants are 
completely familiar with all 
m odels and makes o f 
autom obiles. They also 
feature the famous Deep 
Rock products.

The next time you’ re in the 
area, stop in at the Deep

Dutch’s Body And Glass Shop
Dutch Wheeler-Owner

Many people have looked 
far and wide for someone 
who does good body work. 
The automobiles of today

(panels i
refinish them to their original 
beauty by matching the new 
paint perfectly with the 
original paint.

The professional body men 
in this area to see are 
Dutch’ s Body And Glass 
Shop located at 713 Noel, 
phone 259-2255.

The personnel at this firm 
fully understand body and 
fender work as well as auto 
painting. These men work 
the metal so as to require the 
least amount o f  lead or 
plastic and wet sand the 
surface until it’ s as smooth 
as glass before laying on the 
paint. They have gained a 
reputation second to none 
throughout this entire area. 
So whether your job is a 
small crease or a roll-over, 
we know you will be entirely

satisfied with their work.
Dutch Wheeler has long 

been recognized as this 
section’s leading auto glass 
concern, featuring auto glass 
for all makes and models. 
They are always pleased to 
have you stop in and inquire 
about your particular prob­
lem, whether it be for car or 
truck.

For the very best in 
superior quality auto glass, 
see or call this well known 
company who will gladly give 
free estim ates. They 
guarantee your satisfaction 
on all work.

And, please rem em ber 
that most insurance compan­
ies now permit you to choose 
the body shop you like best to 
repair your car, so choose 
them to do all your insurance 
work.

We, the editors o f this 
1975 Review advise you to 
see Dutch’ s Body And Glass 
Shop for all your bent 
fenders or repair work.

Hightower Texaco 
Service Station

Delbert Hightower-Owner
The Hightower Texaco 

Service Station is located at 
201 Boykin Drive in
Memphis, phone 259-3195.

This is a modern up-to- 
date service station where 
you will find the employees 
courteous and accommodat­
ing. They feature the
well-known Texaco products.

When you stop here they 
are always willing to check 
your car completely. Besides 
just filling up your gas tank, 
they wash your windows, 
check your oil, water and 
tires. They are a complete

one-stop service station for 
your convenience.

They handle only the 
better grades o f  oil and 
gasoline which assures every 
motorist of the most mileage 
per gallon. If your car needs 
an oil change or lube job, 
take it to them and you will 
be pleased with the results.

The writers o f this 1975 
Review are proud to 
recommend the Hightower 
Texaco Service Station to our 
readers. We urge you to visit 
them when you are in town 
shopping.

SLAFFOF THE WEEK *

The writers o f this 1975 
Review therefore com pli­
ment them on their high 
standing in this area.

Hall-Donley Farm Bureau Insurance
Dan Thurman- Agency Manager-Memphis, phone 259-2211

or 259-3431
Ted Shaller-Agent-Clarendon-Phone 874-2471

This firm is located at 1115 
W est Noel in Memphis 
phone 259-2211 or 259-3431. 
There is no institution that is 
conducted in the area, which 
is deserving o f  more 
favorable comment than this 
well known firm. Members 
o f  Farm Bureau and 
subscribers to Farm Bureau 
Insurance have long looked 
to these concerns as serving 
the best interests* of the 
agricultural community with 
service and integrity. Farm 
Bureau was organized in the 
best . interests o f  the 
agricultural community and

dedicated to free market 
practices. Now, Farm 
Bureau Insurance is avail­
able to urban as well as rural 
subscribers.

Each year the value of 
insurance is more than ever* 
recognized as shown by the 
ever increasing number of 
policies that are written, 
When in need of anything in 
the insurance service, you 
can do no better than to take 
your problems to this reliable 
firm who are the local agents 
for Farm Bureau, one o f the 
older and more respected 
firms in America. They meet

the needs o f the people in the 
most straightforward and 
business-like manner and 
offer many protection plans 
to fit all needs, including the 
farm and liability as well as 
auto, life, disability and crop 
hail protection. Farm 
Bureau Insurance is qualified 
under the Keogh plan and 
has a retirement policy 
available.

In writing this 1975 
Review, we, the authors, are 
pleased to suggest that you 
contact the Farm Bureau 
Insurance for all insurance 
needs.

Simpson’s Clothing
Lenis and Grady Simpson

Sim pson’ s Clothing is 
located at 115 South 6th in 
Memphis, phone 259-2317.

Men and young men who 
are seeking up-to-date styles 
and fabrics in suits will find 
exactly what they are 
needing at this popular 
men’ s store. In making their 
bid for the trade o f the 
well-dressed man, this store

has selected a wide range of 
fabrics, styles and pattern - 
clothing that is styled for this 
season and priced for your 
season’ s clothing budget.

If you are going to 
purchase clothing, you cer­
tainly cannot afford to 
overlook the outstanding 
values now being offered at 
Simpson's Clothing. Their

stock includes both the latest 
styles and the more 
conservative patterns.

In this 1975 Review, we, 
the writers, wish to point out 
Simpson’ s Gothing to the 
men and young men o f this 
district. If you are economy 
and value wise, you’ll let 
them serve you for all your 
clothing needs.

Branigan Jewelry
i f Watch-Clock-Jewelry Repair-Stone Setting" 

Elmont Branigan-Owner

Rock Service Station, the 
service station that “ Cares”  
for you and your car.

They are located at 418 
North 16th Street, in 
Memphis, phone 259-9984 
for fast, friendly emergency 
road service.

We, the editors of this 
1975 Review, would like to’ 
call the attention o f  the 
driving public to this fine 
service center. And we 
suggest you stop in soon for 
the best in automotive care. 
We know you’ ll be glad you 
did.

Branigan Jewelry is locat­
ed at 111 South 6th in 
Memphis, phone 259-2023.

They feature diamonds, 
watches, silverware, jewelry, 
and gifts for all occasions. 
When you are buying' 
jewelry, be sure you are 
getting quality merchandise. 
Do not be satisfied with a 
cheap, inferior grade that

lasts only a little while. This 
prominent firm has only the 
best and they will stand 
behind your purchase.

They maintain a watch and 
jewelry repair shop where 
you can have experienced 
craftsmen repair your watch 
or jewelry at a reasonable 
price.

When you are shopping for

a gift, be sure to visit 
Branigan Jewelry and see 
their selection . Their 
employees are courteous and 
helpful and they are happy to 
assist you in selecting any 
item from their large stock.

The compilers o f this 1975 
Review are happy to 
recommend Branigan Jewel­
ry to our readers.

De Ville Best Western Motel
And Restaurant

Mike Vacca-Owner & Operator
If you’~e in the mood for a 

vacation and find you don’t 
have quite enough cash for 
an extended trip, then take a 
“ Weekend Holiday”  instead 
at the De Ville Best Western 
Motel And Restaurant in 
Memphis.
Il 9(11

The De Ville Best Western 
Motel offers you all the 
ingredients of a real holiday

vacation. They have 
luxurious accomodations to 
please even the most 
discrim inating, including: 
heated swimming pool, 
restaurant with banquet 
facilities to accomodate 50 
people. You’ll be sure to 
ewjby-yourself 4
*Kegardless of thlf lengffi"of 

your stay, even if it’ s just for 
dinner or cocktails, you will

always be welcome here.

In com piling this 1975 
Review we, the editors, feel 
it is indeed a pleasure to 
recommend the lie Ville Best 
Western Motel And Resta- 
rant to all our readers. They 

" are located on Highway 287 
North. Phone 259-3583 for 
reservations o f  additional 
information.

Cousins Home, Inc.
Bob Hufffman-Administrator 

Brad Huffman-Asst. Administrator
The Cousins Home, Inc. is 

located at 520 North 18th in 
Memphis. Here they offer 
complete care o f the aged, 
sick, and convalescent.

This nursing home is well 
located, has plenty of 
sunshine, never enough 
noise to bother the sick, yet 
near enough to town so 
friends and*relatives o f 
guests can call without 
inconvenience.

Heating, ventilation and

sanitary arrangements are 
most completely planned for 
the comfort o f each guest and 
all methods are approved by 
the supervising medical 
authortities.

All rooms are light and 
cheerfully decorated, and 
have that home atmosphere 
which has a good psycho­
logical effect.

Their food is prepared by a 
specialist on diets under the 
most sanitary conditions,

Bruce Brothers Mobil Station
"Service You Can Trust" 

Glenn and Boyce Bruce-Owners
The Bruce Brothers Mobil 

Station located at 321 Boykin 
Drive in Memphis, phone 
259-2646 is the place to take 
your car to make sure you are 
getting the best in service.

We all like to feel certain 
we are giving our automobile 
the best o f care. The next 
time you ’ re in Memphis 
shopping, drive your car to 
this deluxe service station for

complete servicing while you 
shop. The attendants at this 
station know their business 
from A to Z, and you can be 
assured that a lube job here 
means more than just a quick 
greasing to “ get through".

They feature the famous 
Mobil products that have 
proven their excellence for 
your automobile. You can

Memphis Compress Company
M.C.

The Memphis Compress 
Company is located in 
Mem phis at 820 Lucile, 
phone 259-2611. They 
feature the best in service.

Through all periods o f 
econom ic fluctuation this 
firm has always been ready 
to serve the best interests of 
the farmers and general

Mackie" Allen, Jr.
public o f this section. They 
have derived more than the 
mere profit as measured by 
dollars and cents because 
there has been a real and 
genuine satisfaction to this 
firm to be able to render this
service.

A business o f this kind is 
essential to the entire

Town and Country Furniture
Jerry Burleson-Owner

Doubtless you plan some 
improvements in your home 
this season. If so, think of 
the Town And Country 
Furniture, «t 618 Main in 
Memphis, phone 259-2235, 
where new and beautiful 
styles and patterns of suites, 
occasional pieces, applianc­
es, lamps, carpets and rugs 
await your Inspection.

This furniture company 
specializes in nationally

advertised lines o f furniture 
with complete delivery and 
installation facilities. In 
short, this progressive store 
offers the maximum o f 
customer satisfaction at a 
minimum price with easy 
terms to fit your budget.

For some time, they have 
served the people of this area 
reliably and well. By 
stocking only items manu­
factured by well established

1 K M .
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Mrs. Kennard [Mary] <
took home a prize catch 
which tipped the scales 
from Greenbelt Lake, 
entered in the fishing

\P lo iU 4 4 t & 4

by UNCLE ZEB
V

*  I

All through the yei 
should think often o 
p re c io u s  M o th e r ... 
especially on this da 
need to spend even 
time in thought and hea 
thankfulness for 
mother. This goes wl 
they are still with 1 
person or in pre 
memory only...I am c 
the lucky ones to still 
my mother. To make i 
even dearer we have 1
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past her 90th birthday 
is a long time, and to yc 
have lost your moth 
years past we assure yc 
a wonderful blessing... 
we congratulated her < 
90th she only said; “ V 
did something .none 
folks ever had happ

giving the guests well 
balanced meals, nourishing 
and appetizing, for rebuild­
ing the health and strength 
so necessary for the inactive 
person.

This and the surrounding 
territory is very fortunate in 
having a nursing home, “ So 
like a home” . The authors of 
this 1975 Review are proud to 
make particular mention of 
this well-run nursing home 
who open their doors to all.

expect good mileage and top 
performance only by giving 
your car the best. The next 
time you are in town, stop at 
the Bruce Brothers Mobil 
Station.

In making this 1975 
Review, we the organizers, 
point with particular com­
mendation to this fine service 
station. Stop in soon, we 
know you’ ll be glad you did.

s?
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Sylvia’ s Ready-T< 
located at 603 M 
Memphis, phone 259- 
one of the leading 
shops in this area, 
them on your next 
town.

They offer a wide s 
of clothing for the dis 
ating, and make a s 
of catering to the la 
desires to be fash;

*  ;i. Gi
-President

section. By fair and honest 
methods they have gained 
the confidence and patron­
age of the people o f this 
community.

A fine spirit of cooperation 
has always been in every 
transaction with this firm and 
we, the writers o f this 
Review, wish to compliment 
them.

» The special atter 
>t}[ our readers is calle< 

1 services provided 
I f George Ferris Flying 

located at 1018 O ev 
Memphis phone 25*! 

.I Aerial crop dusti 
spraying is rapidly bi 

'■{I more and more imp< 
ranchers and farmer 
where. A sudden pi 

I (  harmful insects <

and duly recognized home 
furnishing concerns, they 
have won and held the 
confidence o f  their many . 
patrons. They now serve an 
ever growing clientele o f  
satisfied customers.

No progress report would 
be com plete with recom ­
mendation to the people of 
this , area, and we, the 
writers, do so in our 1975 . 
Review.

Located in Memph 
West Noel, phone ] 
they feature the wel 
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feature minor tune 
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Mr*. Kennard [Mary) Groves o f 1406 S. Colgate in Perryton 
took home a prize catch Wednesday, April 30, with this bass 
which tipped the scales at seven-pounds, four-ounces taken 
from Greenbelt Lake. Mrs. Groves, unfortunately, was not 
entered in the fishing rodeo.

them” ..
When I was a child she 

seem ed precious to me 
naturally. But, one just can’t 
imagine the sort o f Heavenly 
sweetness about a mother 
ninty years young.. To see 
her healthy in a general way, 
not like the old days when 
she could do things for me, 
but in a special way that one 
would have to see to 
appreciate. To have her 
happy, even this in a special 
way-not being anxious about 
the things of this world but a 
sort o f peacefulness that 
must a kin to the future that 
lies a short distance ahead.

We remember the paddl­
ings we used to get, and how 
we knew when we had 
earned one,.We could tell 
that it hurt her even more 
than it did us, and we 
wouldn’t have felt quite 
right if she hadn't gone 
ahead and given us our just 
deserves. We remember 
that as a family we didn’t 
have much of this world's 
goods, but we knew that

\ P lo w in ' & u t 

G o b n e M ,
by UNCLE ZEB

All through the year we 
should think often of our 
p re c io u s  M o t h e r ...B u t , 
especially on this day we 
need to spend even more 
time in thought and heart felt 
thankfulness for our 
mother. This goes whether 
they are still with us in 
person or in precious 
memory only...l am one of 
the lucky ones to still have 
my mother. To make my joy 
even dearer we have her on 
past her 90th birthday..That 
is a long time, and to you that 
have lost your mother in 
years past we assure you it is 
a wonderful blessing...When 
we congratulated her on her 
90th she only said; ‘ ‘Well, 1 
did something .none o f my 
folks ever had happen to

com piling this 1975 
iv we, the editors, feel 
indeed a pleasure to 
mend the De Ville Best 
:rn Motel And Resta- 
j all our readers. They 
cated on Highway 287 

Phone 259-3583 for 
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somehow Mother would 
make it go around to her 
eight children she had to 
begin with. We knew that 
she would take what was left 
after we had all had the best. 
Being the oldest 1 was the 
first to get out and earn some 
money and the first birthday 
we came home with a box o f 
candy for her. We found out 
later that piece by piece she 
dribbled it out to the smaller 
ones.

Anyway, we could write a 
book on memories, and we 
are writing this some three 
weeks ahead o f Mother’s 
Day, if we both make it until 
then, we want it to be the 
most thankful day we have 
ever had.

Whether you have your 
mother on this day this year 
or not, I know each o f you 
join with me in saying God 
Bless You Dear Mother...

Day Care Center
On pretty days, when you 

drive past the city park, you 
will often see a large group of 
happily playing children. 
What you see is not a 
perpetual birthday party, but 
the Day Care Center kids. 
The number o f  children 
attending the Center has 
grown beyond all expecta­
tions. In February there was 
an average of five children; 
in March, twelve; in April 
twenty-three; and now 
twenty-six. There are at 
present four regular workers, 
including the director.

The children, under care­
ful supervision, have quite a 
busy day. They have music 
time, painting time, book 
and block time, a good hot 
lunch, but the highlight of 
the day is playtime in the 
park or perhaps mud pie 
making near the water 
spigot. The children have a 
wonderful opportunity to 
learn to share and to get 
along with each other, but if 
the going gets rough, there is 
always a friendly grown-up, 
lap to cuddle in or a hand to 
hold. The children are 
always delighted when a 
visitor comes, and they greet 
him with wide grins and 
some curiosity.

Although the Center is 
running sm oothly, there 
remain some problems. For 
example, the enrollment will 
increase further when school 
lets out, and when more 
children are added, another 
bathroom is a requirement. 
The bills for the present 
bathrooms and lumber are 
not yet paid off, so there is 
still a terrific financial need. 
The community has been 
most helpful and supportive 
to the Day Care Center, but 
there is still a continual need 
for support and interest. The 
Center is already proving to 
be an asset to Clarendon, 
because more mothers than 
before are now free to work, 
look for work, or pursue 
further education, and the 
children are in a healthful 
and loving environment.

Various fund raising 
events for the Center are 
taking place, such as the 
bake sales at Junior’ s and 
Clifford's on May 10th and 
the Kite Flying Contest at 
the Clarendon College athle­
tic field on May 17th. If you 
have any questions, sugges­
tions, or aid call G rade 
Hammonds at the Day Care 
Center. The number is 2623. 
Go by and visit the children. 
They will brighten your day.
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Sylvia’s Ready-To-Wear
Sylvia Moore-Owner

w, we the organizers, 
with particular com- 

ation to this fine service 
n. Stop in soon, we 
you'll be glad you did.

Sylvia’ s Ready-To-W ear 
located at 603 Main in 
Memphis, phone 259-3379, is 
one of the leading ladies 
shops in this area. Visit 
them on your next trip to 
town.

They offer a wide selection 
of clothing for the discrimin­
ating, and make a specialty 
of catering to the lady who 
desires to be fashionable

attired.
Regardless o f her age, 

figure, or fashion person­
ality, this is the place to find 
just what will please 
milady.

Come in where the 
merchandise is newer and 
the selection greater. People 
of every walk o f life have 
found that clothes from this 
shop are made of the best

pany
y i George Ferris Flying Service

George Ferris-Owner
ident
m. By fair and honest 
ods they have gained 
onfidence and patron- 
of the people o f this
lunity.
ine spirit of cooperation 
always been in every 
action with this firm and 
the writers o f  this 
jw, wish to compliment

li
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The special attention of 
our readers is called to the 
services provided by the 
George Ferris Flying Service 
located at 1018 Cleveland in 
Memphis phone 259-2000.

Aerial crop dusting and 
spraying is rapidly becoming 
more and more important to 
ranchers and farmers every­
where. A sudden plague of 
harmful insects can be

<9
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Located in Memphis at 921 
West Noel, phone 259-9992 
they feature the well known 
Mobil products. They also 
feature minor tune-ups on 
automoblies and pick-ups 
and handle the finest in tires, 
batteries, and accessories.

The lubrication o f a car 
properly and often, length­
ens the life of the machine a 
great deal. If you would like

quickly and easily destroyed 
by 'an airplane. This firm 
specializes in mesquite and 
sage brush spraying. In just 
a few minutes an airplane 
can effectively cover a large 
area. You are cordially 
invited to call for information 
or estimates.

Now is the time to 
investigate the many advan-

Jim’s Mobil
Jim Barbee-Owner
to have proper lubrication 
and the finest service for 
your car, drive in at this 
efficient station. With 
courteous service they have 
built-up a reputation that is 
to be envied.

Motorists appreciate little 
things such as clean, sanitary 
rest rooms, clean drives, and 
a well kept station. These

A lanreed News
P la in s m e n  Q u a r t e t

materials, and priced to fit 
your budget.

Here you will find 
nationally advertised brands, 
helpful and friendly sales 
personel - all o f these things 
contribute to make shopping 
here a real pleasure.

This 1975 Review, and its 
copyists, make particular 
mention of this well-liked 
ladies shop.

tages of aerial crop dusting 
and spraying by writing or 
calling the George Ferris 
Flying Service. Don’t lose a 
complete crop when for a 
small amount you can save it 
with this service from this 
reliable, well quialified 
company.

We, the writers of this 
1975 Review sincerely re­
commend this firm.

are some o f the things that 
make a first-class station 
such as this one.

In this 1975 Review we, 
the narrators, wish to urge 
all our readers to drive to the 
Jim’ s Mobil. They check 
your oil, inflate your tires to 
the correct pressure, clean 
your windshield, and service 
your car in a most 
professional manner.

By the time a man is in 
shape to buy his wife 
beautiful clothes-she isn’t.

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Dan Keller is their friend. 
Yvone from San Diego, 
California.

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Stubbs on the 28th was 
Bob’s sister Kay.

Mr. and Mrs. Glen Hallum 
are the proud parents o f a 
new baby daughter born 
April 29th at Houston. The 
Hallums have one other 
child, a daughter Dianna. 
Mrs. Hallum is- the former 
Kay Hall, o f Alanreed.

Observers tell us that 
robins follow  35 degree 
temperature from winter 
quarters clear up to northern 
Alaska.

Mrs. Bill Crisp, grandson 
Chad, Mrs. Art Rhode and 
daughter Robin went fishing 
last Friday afternoon. They 
reported some very good 
catches.

Mrs. Don Wilson o f Lake 
McClellan was in Pampa in 
the 28th on business.

Mr. and Mrs. Burl Stubbs 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Crisp on W ednesday 
night the 30th.

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Crisp has been their 
neice from New Mexico. Jan 
plans a short visit with other 
friends and relatives while 
here.

Some people want to check 
government spending and 
some others want to spend 
government checks.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Crisp 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Crisp and Bill’ s cousin 
Jan last Tuesdav afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. W.R. Beck 
and daughter Kellie Jo were 
in Clarendon on business on 
the 30th.

Alanreed School turned 
out early on Wednesday the 
30th as the water pump went 
" P o o f ”  and the children 
were not a bit sorry to get to 
go home early.

Anything is simple, once 
you understand it.

Mrs. Nell Fullbright went 
to Lubbock last Wednesday 
to be with her daughter-in- 
law Connie who underwent 
gall bladder surgery Friday 
morning. Connie is reported 
to be doing excellent at this 
time and should be home 
soon.

Mrs. Bill Crisp was in 
Pampa and Amarillo on the 
29th on business.

Mr. and Mrs. H.H. 
Worsham visited with Mrs. 
W orsham ’ s parents and 
Frank Cris’ s on May 1st.

Mr. and Mrs. William 
Bradley visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. W .R . Beckon the 
evening of May 1st.

Mr. and MrA. Joe Leonard 
visited with Mrs. Jess Finley 
last Tuesday morning.

W orry is the advance 
interest you pay on troubles 
that seldom come.

Allen Mason, son of Mr.

Tennis Tournament 
To Be Held Sunday

The first Donley County 
Invitational Tennis Tourna­
ment will be held Sunday 
afternoon at the Clarendon 
college Tennis Courts. 
Sixteen players will be 
playing in the tournament.

Early entries are; Lloyd 
Rfstey, C larendon; Kern 
Pigg, Clarendon; Mary Ann 
Gilbreth, Antonito, Colora­
do; Frank Griffin, Graver; 
James Huff, Clayton, New 
M exico; Russell Franklin, 
Gallup, New Mexico; Bill 
Spier, Clarendon; Curtis 
W ashburn, Filoyd. New 
M exico; Ken McCartney, 
Quanah; Jerry Courtney, 
Clarendon; Barry Tyler, 
Clarendon; and Ronnie Null. 
Clarendon.

First round action will 
begin at 1:30 p.m. Sunday; 
anyone interested in playing, 
call Lloyd Risley, Kern Pigg. 
or Ronnie Null. There are 
still four places open.

^ ° § p H n g

°Sale
All Furniture 

Paintings 
Objects O f Art 

Lamps 
Gifts At 
Reduced 
Prices!

H u g l& s
H ow e Beautiful 

2740 Duniven Circle 
Amarillo

by MRS. JESS FINLEY

and Mrs. Morris Mason was 
home on leave last week end 
from Ft. Sill, Oklahoma.

Mr. and Mrs. Morris 
Mason are moving soon to 
the Ranch Headquarters.

Mrs. James Armbrister 
visited the school last 
Thursday, on the way home 
she visited with her mother 
Mrs. Richard Dragoo. 
the money’s coming from.

Those who have sufficient 
grounds for divorce often 
didn ’ t have sufficient 
grounds for marriage.

Overweight is often just 
desserts.

Mr. and Mrs. William 
Bradley, Donald and Suzy 
spent last weekend in 
Amarillo with friends and 
relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. James 
Armbrister and children 
were in Pampa on business 
last Saturday afternoon.

Mr. C.P. Hamilton is the
In McLean on business last 

brown Chrysler, purchased 
this past week.

Some people seem to want 
to know where money paid in 
taxes go. They should be 
more concerned with where

Visaing the W.R. Beck last 
Sunday were the following, 
Mr. and Mrs. R.W. Beck, 
Dal and Nancy from LeFors, 
W .R.’s aunt and uncle from 
Miami, Mary Kimes, and 
Red Nelson, Mr. and Mrs. 
A.L. Sykes, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jess Finley and Ramona.

Quite a large cattle 
working took place at our 
new neighbors the W .R . 
Beck’ s. Mr. Beck works, or 
rather manages and works 
the farm south o f Alanreed 
and manages the cattle ranch 
north o f Alanreed for the 
owners. The owners of the 
two places are Nelson- 
Sykes of Pampa. The cattle 
working took place on the 
4th. Everyone who was there 
really worked and it was a 
most enjoyable time had, by 
the workers and the visitors.

It is hard to get lost on a 
straight road.

Mrs. G.L. Simmons was in 
McLean on business last 
Friday afternoon.

In McLean on business last 
Thursday afternoon was 
Mrs. Dan Keller of Alanreed.

Mr. and Mrs. Jow Leonard 
was in Clarendon on 
business on last Saturday 
afternoon.

Some people grow flowers, 
gardens, crops; others 
simply grow old.

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
Burl Stubbs last week end 
was Mrs. Stubbs mother and 
grandmother from Abiline.

Mr. Burl Stubbs hurt his 
knee last week but it is much 
better at this time.

Wish there was some rain ’ 
to report but-there was none 
and we sure could use some.

Mrs. H.W. Burr visited 
with her parents, the Frank 
Crisp’s last Sunday.

One-half inch rain fell at 
the Jess Finley place South 
o f Alanreed last Sunday 
afternoon.

Please feel free to call 
Mrs. Jess Finley 779-3147 at 
any time to report you 
Alanreed News, h is needed 
and wanted. Thank you.

The national famous 
"P lainsm en Q uartet" will 
appearing at the Olsen Park 
Baptist Church, 3315 Han­
cock Saturday May 10 at 7:30 
p.m. and Sunday May 11 at 
11:00 a.m.

The Plainsmen are known 
in the gospel field of music 
for such songs as Cowboy 
camp meeting. W onderful 
time up there, Glory band, 
How great they aren't. This 
little light of mine, and This 
old house.

They have starred at state 
fairs in Oklahoma. Arkansas, 
Missouri. Illinois, Kansas. 
Nebraska, South Dakota, 
North Dakota. Montana and 
Colorado.

They have appeared with 
Roy Clark on Hee Haw. and 
the late Red Foley.

In 1973 and 74 the 
Plainsmen entertained over 
200,000 people.

There is no charge. The 
public b  invited to see and 
hear this marvelous group 
sing ______________________

INSURANCE 

FOR YOUR

HOME

RANCH

FARM

AUTO

CROPS

LIFE

For help with insurance 
questions and needs call. .

TEXAS FARM BUREAU 
INSURANCE COMPANIES

•74-2471

T e d S k ’

ON

DINNERWARE

OPEN STOCK 3-pc. PLACE SETTINGS

F lorence

Vqungcr than springtime frwt 
flowers and foliage, beautifully 
carved hand pauMed in ultramarine 
blue charteuse green and white 
•pan UK* Value I f  JO. *P€C 13 JR

i  vaoatabi*. Our.

all-occasion dinnwewarw

An all-over flora l in warm  cinnam on tones, w ith a 
hand-painted swirl-feature under the pi 
piece a distinctive individuality. The j 
hand-crafted shapes are remii 
French provincial styling.

iiuIIIuii n m ci, Willi «
• *’v” « «--7
lie gracefully rounded, 
t  of old-world Country

HENSON'S
We C iv* 

NAS STAMPS

Buy, Build or 
Save With ••• FIRST FEDERAL

Conventional, FHA 
and V A  Home Loans

Conventional and FHA T itle  I 
Home Improvement Loans

■ id  • a n t  H i r m  h ig h e s t h t a r t i f  r a te s  < 
RBOULATIONt

Day- In to Day-Out Interest 
—  No Penalty Passbook

5 . 2 5 %
A YEAR COMPOUNDED 
DAILY
paid from date o f deposit to 
date of withdrawal

5 . ” %
A YEAR COMPOUNDED 

DAILY FOR AN EFFECTIVE 
ANNUAL YIELD OF

5 .M%
M Day Account* 11.000 Minitniui

7.*°%
A YEAR COMPOUNDED 

DAILY FOR AN EFFECTIVE 
ANNUAL YIELD OF

7. T*%
4 Yean, $1,000.00 Minimum

5.39%
when interest is left to 
accumulate for one year 
ADD TO OR WITHDRAW 
ANY AMOUNT, ANY TIME.

6 . ” %
A YEAR COMPOUNDED 

DAILY FOR AN EFFECTIVE 
ANNUAL YIELD OF

6 . -  %
30 Months, $1,000.00 Mtnimuim

INSURED
O P  TO 

5 4 0 , 0 0 0

7 . ” %
AYEARCOMPOUNDED 

DAILY FOR AN EFFECTIVE 
ANNUAL YIELD OF

« . - %
(• Years. 1.000HO Minimum) 

V  Effective 12-23-74)

FIRST FED ERAL
S A V IN G S  ft LO A N  A S S O C IA TIO N

renr
9th A  M ala  

lomphis, Texas
806/259-2152

r
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W | Appreciate Year Business

wear...
for Mother

We have a large 
■election of accesaorles

.<38?

Willie Johnson’s Hedley
Mrs. Clarence Welch was 

released from  the Hall 
County Hospital in Memphis 
last Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Jewell 
of Hereford visited in Hedley 
Tuesday. They were in route 
home from Dallas.

The U.M. W. of the Hedley 
Methodist Church met in the 
home of Mrs. Betty Williams 
Tuesday April 27. After the 
business, a very interesting 
program was given. Mrs. 
Williams gave the Devotional 
and Mrs. W illie Johnson 
gave the lesson using the life 
o f Hannah as Samuel’ s 
mother and lcabod's mother, 
one o f the unnamed mothers 
of the Bible. Members 
present for the meeting were 
M esdam es Mable Jones. 
Gertude Boatright. W illie 
Johnson, Verda Hinds and 
the Hostess Mrs. Williams. 
This week will begin the 
work of the altar cloths at the 
Hedley Methodist Church. 
Wednesday being the day set 
for the work to begin.

The Hedley High School 
annual Junior • Senior 
Banquet last Tuesday even­
ing was well attended. It was 
held in the beautifully 
decorated Lion's Club Build­
ing. Connie Debord o f the 
Hedley High School faculty 
was the speaker.

Ike Rains came home from 
the Hospital Monday but had 
to return Thursday. He is in 
Groom Memorial Hospital. 
His condition is reported 
unchanged.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Altman 
visited Rev. and Mrs. Larry 
Altman at Corpus Christi the 
past week. They also visited 
their Daughter, Lana Adams, 
and family in route.

Fred Stafford and Clifford 
Johnson attended the May 
meeting o f the Board of 
Directors o f the Greenbelt 
Water Authority Thursday 
evening. The meeting was 
held in the conference room 
at the filter plant at 
Greenbelt Lake with dinner 
to follow at the Clarendon 
Country Club. All five 
member cities and the State 
Water Development Board 
were represented at this 
meeting.

Mr. and Mrs. J.S. Hinds 
have been visiting Mr. Hinds 
father in Abilene.

County Clerk, P.C. Mes­
ser, had surgery in the Hall 
County Hospital in Memphis 
last week, His condition is 
reported good.

Tim Riekn o f  Ft. Sill, 
Oklahoma, was in Hedley 
Wednesday.

Mrs. Herlie Moreman and 
Mrs. Clifford Johnson were 
in Clarendon W ednesday 
morning on 1919 Study Club 
Year Book business.

The nominating committee 
of the Hedley Lions Club met 
at the City Hall last Tuesday 
evening. The com m ittee

consists o f Frank Murray, 
Chairman, Jack Stafford. 
John Waddell and Garlan 
Gardenhire. Lion President 
Jack Stafford and Secretary- 
treasurer Oneil W eatherly 
met with the committee. The 
club will vote on the 
nominees chosen at the next 
lions meeting Thursday 
evening May 22.

Mr. and Mrs. Tige Hill and 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Johnson were among the 
Hedley folks attending the 
Eastern Star in Clarendon 
last week.

Leon Freeman of Hedley 
was honored at the Amarillo 
C ollege annual Athletic 
Banquet when he was 
presented the Don Powell 
Memorial Award. His coach. 
Bill McDonald, made some 
very complimentary remarks 
about Leon’ s work on the 
basketball team.

A big crowd o f Hedley 
citizens turned out to see the 
basketball game o f the year 
Thursday evening at the 
Hedley High School Gym 
when the Dirty Half Dozen 
tangled with the Faculty 
Fruit Loopers which consis­
ted o f  m embers o f  the 
Hedley School faculty and 
school board.

The Faculaty Fruit Loopers 
dressed in many styles of 
women's dress were Troy 
Lemley, Doyle M esser, 
Glyndon Holland, Garlan 
Freeman, Connie Debord, 
and board members T.E. 
Natlor and Harold White. 
The Dirty Half Dozen 
consisted of Hedley High 
School Seniors and Ex 
Seniors. They were dressed 
in many different styles of 
women’ s wear.

They were Debbie Debord, 
Lee Ann Woodard, Lou Ann 
Drum, Geneva Naylor, Jane 
Wood, Shauna Monroe, and 
Jean Stafford. Sharon 
Wheatly was their coach and 
M erelen Sargent Cheer 
Leader. Midge Lemley was 
cheer leader for the Faculaty 
and Flossie W ood and 
Martha Nell Hill were the 
coaches. The referees were 
Terry Collins and Raymond 
Woodard. This was one o f  * 
those rare games where both 
sides lose.

Mrs. Sharon Stafford 
presented her piano and 
voice students in a recital at 
the Hedley United Methodist 
Church Friday evening May 
2 at 7:30 p.m.

Piano students include 
Darrin Clendennen, Linda 
Kennedy, Kelly Woodard, 
Otis and Shane Farris, 
Brandi A dcock. Stephanie 
Holland. Debbie Clubb, 
Susan Johnson, Kim Wood­
ard, Andy Wheatley. Susan 
Couch, Kim Taylor, Shonda 
Stafford. Linda and Brinda 
Swinney. Paula Clendennen 
and Sherrie Hill.

Voice students include

Barbara's Fabric Mart
Downtown Clarondon 

Anniversary Sale throughout May

Remember MOTHER with a 
gift certificate, 

scissors, dress form, or jewelry

Pick & Choose—
100 yd. Suraline Heather Knits

* c  * *  s4 “  - - i*

Let me help yea Sew L  Save

"Happy M dhersDay

Amy Lemley, Lamoss 
Springer and Laura Ann 
Wheatley.

Vanesa Myers of Amarillo 
spent the week end in Hedley 
visiting Mrs. Sam Younger 
and family and Hedley 
friends.

Mr. and Mrs. Roger 
Gibson were in Hedley 
Saturday. They live in 
Amarillo.

Mrs. H.G. Hartwell is in 
Amarillo for a medical check 
up. She is staying with her 
son and family.

Mrs. Alene Zackery, a 
neiceof Mrs. Mabel Bridges, 
from Heneryetta visited 
Mabel last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin 
Winters o f Amarillo spent 
the weekend with Mrs, 
Myrtel Kirkpatrick.

The Hedley School Lunch­
room menu for this Thursday 
and Friday, is Thursday: 
Kitchen made burritos, 
green salad, buttered corn, 
fruit, peanut butter cookies 
and milk and Friday: Chicken 
salad on lettuce leaf, broccoli 
with cheese sauce, celery 
sticks, batter bread and milk.

Floyd Crafford, a former 
Hedley resident, was in 
Hedley Saturday.

Adell Myers and Gyde 
Tidwell o f Pampa spent part 
o f last weekend working at 
Adells place in Hedley.

Joe Adams has been 
released from St. Anthony’ s 
Hospital in Amarillo and is 
back at home.

Mr. and Mrs. Burt Stone 
spent last weekend in Pampa 
visiting the Danny Stones.

New plate glass windows 
were set in the Hedley Youth 
Center last week. It adds a 
lot to the appearance o f their 
building.

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Love 
of Amarillo visited in Hedley 
Sunday and attended the 
Sunday morning service of 
the Hedley United Methodist 
Church.

Rev. and Mrs. J .W . 
Rosenberg of Pampa attend­
ed the Sunday morning 
service of the Hedley United 
Methodist Church.

Rev. and Mrs. J .W . 
Rosenberg of Pampa attend­
ed the Sunday morning 
service of the Hedley United 
Methodist Church. Bro. 
Rosenberg participated in 
the service. They visited 
H edley friends after the 
service and had Lunch with 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Moore.

The young people of the 
Hedley M ethodist Church 
gave a program at the 
Nursing Home in Garendon 
Sunday at 2:30 p.m.

Mrs. Wanda Ann Richards 
o f  Amarillo visited her 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Hansard Saturday.

Mrs. W .A. Pierce is in the 
Hall County Hospital in 
Memphis.

Mrs. Edythe Carter o f 
Panhandle is here because o f 
the illness of her mother

Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Bridges. Karen and Kent of 
Amarillo, spent the weekend 
with Bill’ s mother Mrs. 
Mabel Bridges.

Richard ahaw from St. 
Worth visited his mother 
Mrs. Mildred Shaw and 
brother Randy Friday.

A lot o f work has been 
done on the Cherry Drug 
Store building this week. 
The building will house the 
new Hedley Amusement 
Center. They plan to be open 
for this the Mothers Day 
holiday weekend.

The Hedley High School 
Graduating class were the 
guests o f the First Baptist 
Church of Hedley at their 11 
a.m. Sunday morning ser­
vice. Loren Denton o f  
Memphis, County Judge of 
Hall County, was the 
speaker. Special-music was 
furnished by the Church 
choir.

Virgil McPherson and

Jaycee Chapter
A Clarendon Jaycee chap­

ter has been chartered by the 
Texas Jaycee organization. 
The local group has 24 
charter members and will 
receive its official charter in 
the very near future.

Meetings will be held in 
the former Jaycee room in 
the City Hall building. 
Meeting time will be at 9 
p.m. each Tuesday evening.

Elected to head the 
Clarendon club was Wes 
Henson, president; Donnie 
Mooring, Internal Vice-pre­
sident; Mike Spier, External 
Vice-president; Larry Green, 
secretary-treasurer, and Bill 
Spier as state director.

Directors for the club will 
be George Nelson, Earnie 
Johnston and Terry Ashcraft.

Henson said Tuesday that 
the club will be holding its 
charter banquet in the near 
future. An announcement 
date will follow. Additional 
new members are invited, 'i 
To be eligible, a candidate 
must be between the ages of 
18 and 35 and be willing to 
contribute his time and 
efforts to bettering the 
community.

Burk DeBord returned from a 
fishing trip Sunday.

Visitors in the home o f Mr. 
and Mrs. J.S. Hinds to spend 
the day Sunday were Mr. and 
Mrs. Buford Hinds of Anson, 
Mrs. Weldon Rives and Boys 
of Clarendon. Mrs. Nancy 
Ritchie and Shelia o f 
Hereford and Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Hall o f Lubbock.

Otis Holland and Rev. J.J. 
Terry attended the Top O’ 
Texas Area Babtist Zone 
meeting and dinner at 
Pampa Monday.

The charter of the Hedley 
Lions Gub is dated May 13, 
1942. The Hedley Gub was 
sponsored by the Garendon 
Lions Club. There were 20 
Charter members of which 10 
are still living. They will 
observe their 31st Anniver- 
wary with a Ladies Night 
Banquet Thursday evening 
May 22 at 8 p.m.

The Hedley High School 
Gass o f 197S left on the 
annual trip Tuesday morn­
ing. They plan to visit points 
in Missouri, Arkansas and 
other states before return­
ing.

Mrs. Becky Doss o f 
Memphis visited her mother 
Mrs. Opal McPherson Satur­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Moore were among those 
visiting Mrs. W .A. Pierce in 
the Hall County Hospital in 
Mimphis Sunday.

Burk DeBord o f  the 
Ashtola Community was in 
Hedley Monday.

Mrs. U.J. Boston o f 
Amarillo has been visiting 
Myrtle Reeves.
The U.M.W. of the Hedley 

United Methodist Church 
met with Mrs. Verda Hinds 
Tuesday.

Johnny Hoggard came in 
Tuesday for a two weeks 
vacation. He is connected 
with the city of Tulia Police 
Department.

Bud Davis, o f the West 
Texas Utilites Company, was 
in Hedley Monday. He is 
from Childress.

Hedley pets were innocu- 
lated for rabies at the Hedley 
City Hall Monday afternoon.

The U .M .Y . o f  the 
Methodist Church met at the 
Hedley Youth Center at 7:30 
p.m. Wednesday.

The Midweek service of 
the First Baptist Church was 
an important Church confer­
ence Wednesday evening at 
8 p.m.

Mr. and Mrs. J.M. Baker 
spent the weekend in Pampa.

They were visiting Mrs. 
Baker’s brother.

Mrs. Ruth Stiles had a lot 
of weekend company.

THE CLARENDON PRESS
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Mrs. Reuben Johnson of 
Hedley visited her parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Medenhall 
Monday.

M r. and Mrs. C .R. 
Clement o f Borger visited 
her sister Inez Skinner 
Friday night and Saturday.

Mrs. Jewel Short spent the 
weekend with relatives in 
Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Junior 
Wilkinson and children of 
Shamrock visited his mother 
Mrs. Mae Wilkinson Satur­
day. _____

Subscription rates in Donley County 
$5.50 per year. Outside County $7.50 per year.
The combined issue of the newspapers above Is published 
weekly on Thursday every week of the year, at offices located 
at the intersection of highway 287 and Jefferson street in 
Clarendon, Texas.
The Clarendon Press is entered as second class matter In the 
U.S. Post Office, Clarendon, Texas 79226.

The Clarendon Press was established on May 1, 1972, In 
Clarendon, Texas. The Donley County Leader and Clarendon 
News were combined with the Clarendon Press on December
1, 1974.
Any erroneous reflection upon the character o f any person or 
firm appearing in these columns will be promptly corrected 
upon being brought to the attention of the publisher, Jerry G. 
Sparks. The Clarendon Press, Donley County Leader and 
Clarendon News are owned by Dean Singleton.

Beta Sigma Phi sorority presented a check for $125 to the Day
Care Center last week which represented proceeds from the 
annual charity ball held April 5. Susan Henson, right, 
presented the check to Mrs. Horace Green. The sorority has 
now contributed a total of $300 to the center.

r. Leila Lake
Fruit Stand

H w y  2 8 7

Bast Buys la Frash 
Fruits Aad Vogatablas

Farm Fresh Eggs. 

SEAFOOD
Channel Catfish Shrimp 

Oysters In shell

Frem

S
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la th  Adbnw earned April’* *25 prize ■aaay for the largest panfish weighed in during the Chamber of Commerce fishing 
too at Greenbeh Lake. Adams weighed in a crappie o f one-pound, four-ounces to lead the panfish division. Sandra mooring, 
unber director, presented the prize money Friday. The rodeo will continue for two more months with prize money awarded 
i»  month and grand prizes given at the end o f the contest.

★ ★ ★ * ★ * ★ *  good fishing.

Pete Darnell was SSO richer last Friday following the presentation of prize money in the Clarendon Chamber of Commerce 
fishing rodeo at Greenbeh Lake. Darnell won the Northern Pike and catfish division for the month of April with a 13-pound pike 
caught late in April. Sandra Mooring, a member of the board of directors for the chamber presented the prize money.

ments. We missed those of 
you who were out. Come on 
down.

The District 11 Jamboree 
was May 3 in Pampa. 
Several couples attended 
from our club.

Remember May 27 is 
graduation night. Everyone 
be there and get our new 
dancers welcomed into our 
club as members.

State Tickets Sales are 
doing well.

Remember Thursday May 
15 is Family Night with an 
early buffet follow ed by 
Bingo at 8:00.

Y-Knot
Twirlers

The Y Knot ’Twirlers 
danced April 29 to Freddie 
M cK ee. Three squares 
danced. George and Rita 
Shields provided refresh-

McMujry - 70-68. Champion 
ship flight - David Parker - 
John Zett - 66-63, Eddie 
Duenkel • Max Hickey - 
64-66, David Mooring-Gary 
Beddingfield • 64-67 tied 
with Dick Weston - Marvin 
Dick. Weston and Dick won 
the playoff.

Next Monday May 12 we 
will have partnership bridge 
from 7:00 in the evening with 
$20.00 added. Bring a 
partner and give it a try.

*  John and Polly Sarich are
*  sporting a brand new car.
*  Do you know the Senior
*  Citizens Social Center is
*  having knitting and crochet-
*  ing classes now on Tuesday 

afternoon. I hear it is real 
nice. Also on the first 
Monday of each month, they 
have a blood pressure clinic. 
Some are finding they have 
dangerously high pressure. 
It is free.

I hope all o f you will have a 
happy weekend.

Sharon

Howardwick Party Line
By Sharon Mills

Good morning, to you on 
:he party-line!

First o f all, remember the 
ty hall meeting will be this

for the weekend. Others 
down were the J.A. Blevins 
o f Vega, who are here for a 
weeks vacation. Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Pearce have been 
down also the past week.

Bill and Shirley Castner 
and children ate supper with 
his parents Morris and Eddie 
Castner last Sunday.

Melville and Ruth Mills 
and daughter, Sharon, and 
Will and Norma Corgill were 
in Amrillo Thursday to do 
some shopping and eating. 
After eating two meals there 
they felt as though they 
didn’t want to see another 
bite o f food. But Saturday 
the same Corgills.'Henry and 
Cora Bland went with Albert 
and Trula Moore to Amarillo 
to do a little celebrating.

Grace Castner's cousin, 
Tom Collins and his wife, 
Helen, dropped by for awile 
Saturday. Ed Castner’ s 
neice's son and wife, Mr. 
and Mrs. Kenneth Wesson of

Boss Lion and Mrs. John 
Sarith, Lion and Mrs. Ralph 
Benge and Lion Glenn Doty 
attended the Lions’ District 
Meeting in Pampa last week. 
Lion Glenn Doty will be the 
next Deputy District Gover­
nor. At the Necrology 
Services there were twenty- 
seven from this district. Two 
T. One, three of whom were 
from Howardwick. They 
were Jack B. Boline. George 
Howard *nd Lars (Sonnt) 
Ockander. Those attending 
the memorial service from 
Howardwick were Mrs. Lena 
Howard, Lion and Mrs. 
Glenn Doty and Boss Lion 
John Sarich.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Childs were down for the 
weekend. Mrs. Childs told 
me all about their new 
grandson. His name is 
Stephen Douglas. The proud 

em em bered as .profound parents are Airman First 
Statements. One of those is Class Gary and Linda Childs, 
woving itself more every The baby was bom in

irday. The time has been 
lged to 10:00 a.m. from 

p.m.
ow for the Lions’ News.

Don Tumor —:— Don’s Welding
Residence - 1625 S. Baylor 

Perryton, Texas 806 - 435-5246

P orta b le  O ilfie ld  & F eed lo t W e ld in g  
Farm - Ranch 6i Shop Welding 

Fabrication & Repair Work 
Steel. Building Construction 

We Design & Build Almost Anything-
$300,000.00 Liability Insurance

- Clarendon Shop -
Highway 287 East - 

South of Chamberlain Motors
Roddy Klinnert - Shop Foreman

Box 966 Clarendon, Texas 79226 806 874-2642
Windmill & Submersible Pump Repair 

Trenching & Light- Winch Service 
South of 1-40 Only

Auction Sales Service
Complete sales service. Machinery  
cattle, real estate. 30 years 
experience in general farm  sales. 
Bonded ft licensed. Call

Cleatus Ca llow ay
405-335-3233  
Fredrick, O kla.

OR
Regan Bain

874-2392 Clarendon, Texas

The Western dance band 
from Fort Sill was well 
received by the crowd at the 
club last Thursday night. If 
you missed this one please 
watch for future billings. 
They are good.

Emma Deaver hosted a 
group of friends for Bridge at 
the club on Friday.

The go lf course was 
humming with activity all 
week. The ladies golf 
association participated on

Ml American, the farmer parents art Mr. 'and Mrs. 
vho owns his own land.”  Kenneth Vaughan o f Claren- 
\4any theories abound. don. Mrs. Childs said the 
Robert Aubery lists it as a only trouble is they don’t get 
manifestation o f what he to see their new grandson 
calls the ’ ‘Territorial Imper- until December, 
a tive.”  Others observe 
simply that a man will work 
harder for himself than for 
someone else. Undoubtedly 
true, but another, immeas­
urable factor is involved... 
pride. American farmers are 
proud to be able to each 
produce enough for them­
selves and 50 others. And 
they’ re smart. Smart enough 
to use the right portions of 
ecology, machanization, 
chem ical know-how and 
management to make the 
same land produce more 
every year. In 65 years 
production per acre has 
increased more than 620 
percent. The Rough Rider 
was right, we can’t afford to 
lose the family farmer.

anniversary Monday, the 
fifth.

Mr. and Mrs. John Collins 
were in Lubbock Monday. 
Mr. Collins had a checkup 
and doesn’t need to go back 
for another three weeks. 
Maybe he can get in some

Clements -147, Larry Ripple 
- Buddy Karr - 149, B.J. 
Jordon - Ralph Collingsworth 
-149. Larry and Buddy won 
the playoff.

Second flight - Bob Selman 
• John Sidlow • 140, Bill 
Allison • Don Rosebuck • 142 
and Doug Coffee - James 
Daugherty - 143.

First Flight - Tex Welch - 
Robert Mills - 68-67, Buddy 
Saunders • John Franklin • 
68-68, Milton Kasch - Joe

A u to m o b ile  S e rv ic e  
T ip s

soLfuao v T

SVUntR 60LENOIP swmzh/ A  f Y j l p i
CONNECTS m  BATTBRY 70  Z /\ ,a VJ/ A
THE STARTER MOTOR. / /  f l jA w
POOR CONNECTIONS ANP
AGE REDUCE SOLENOIDS / / 1 '
ABILITY to p a s s  enough
Electricity To t u r n  r®  \ \ \
t h e  s ta r t e r  m o to r  (P  \ L
f a s t  e n o u g h  t£> t  #  I
START THE ENGINE.

It's  tim e to choose your ring
SeH Service Cm  24 Hears Day 

ALL including SOUL

J  Track Sturuu Tapes
(Fully Oearanteed)

J  ^  S t e a k h o

Charcoal

Liquid Detergent
Tennis Shoes

Memphis Broach 
FIRST FEDERAL 
SAVINA ft LOAN 

• f  Childress 
S. 9th ft Mala 

Memphis, Tex.

Large RollEddie Floyd Shop
ltd  Sully 874-3776

Yeur M other's Day 

Headquarters
I Hems for year every need

Shurfine
Folgers 3# Can

C*Hm *2
Shurfine
Fruit Cocktail

Cera Dogs

Shorts ft Tops 

A Up
Lingerio

$6 °° & Up
B O L A N D

POLYNESIA
Ring* from tlOO to SIO OOO

Keepsake assures perfect 
clarity, fine white color and 
precise cut

7 Days A Wook - 345 Days Y
Chickens
Bar-B-QLadies Sports 

Wear

CONVENIENCE store
Downtown Memphis

22nd- The other gratUL* jfay qyenipo. •# Thiusday then the Chamber
parents art Mr. -and Mm** -CongraTulattons to the o f  TSm m erce tournament , 
Kenneth Vaughan of Claren- Glenn Dotys. They celebrat- 1™* .°«?rJ 01r * week en<** 
don. Mrs. Childs said the ed their fourteenth wedding Third flight winners were tlie j i H a n n m J



!

Flowtr Poti
Corelle by Corning

Electric Appllcance
Clocks

We heve many many mere lewely gifts, 
come by and brewse end select year gift

V o i c e  i n  t b t  'W ild e r n e s s CHURCH OF GOD IN CHRIST
302 N. Jefferson 

C. H. Duncan

a s s e m b l y  o f  g o d
Sth & McClelland 

874-2195
Wesley Sanders, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School............................9:45 a.m.
Sunday Worship.......................11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship ..7:00 p.m. 

Tuesday
Women’s Missionary Council.1 p.m 

Wednesday
Night Service..............................7:30 p.m

ST. JOHN BAPTIST EPISCOPAL 
3rd A Parks 

Pettigrew V. Hamilton 
Sunday

Sunday School...................10:00 a. m
Services....................................11:00 a.m
Holy Communion 1st, 3rd, A  Sth 
Sundays.

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH

Sth & Jefferson 
874-3667

Weldon Rives, Pastor 
Sunday

Sunday School...........................9:45 a.m
Morning Worship.....................10:50 p.m
Youth Program......................... 6:00 p.m
Evening Worship....................... 7:00 p.m

I James McKinney

(In My Home)
Call Day or Night 874-3457 Free Estimates

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Bugbee & Third Streets 

874-3833
James Brandon, Pastor 

Sunday

In those days came John the Baptist, preaching in the 
wilderness o f Judaea,

And saying, Repent ye: for the kingdom o f heaven is 
at hand.

For this is he that was spoken of by the prophet of 
Esaias, saying, The voice o f one crying in the wilderness. 
Prepare ye the way o f the Lord, make his paths straight.

And the same John had his raiment o f camel's hair, and  
a leathern girdle  about his loins, and his meat was locusts 
and w ild honey.

Then went out to him Jerusalem, and a ll Judaea, and all 
the region round about Jordan.

St. Matthew  3 1 -5

Sunday School .... 
Morning Worship 
Training Union ... 
Evening Worship

Wednesday

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
Hedley, Texas 

874-3663
Kathryn Pigg. Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School..........................10:00 a.m
Morning Worship..............11:00 a.m
Bible Study................................ 6:00 p.m

Wednesday
Youth Service............................ 7:00 p.m

MARTIN BAPTIST CHURCH
Clarendon, Texas 

Charlie Floyd, Pastor, 
Sunday

Sunday School.................10:00a.m.
Church Service..................11:00 a.m.
Evening Service................. 7:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service................................7:00 p.m

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
4th & Carhart 

874-2495
Don Stone, Minister 

Sunday

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
Hwy. 287 & Jackson 

874-3479
R. W. Sullivan, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School...................10:00 a.m.
Sunday Worship...............11:00 a.m.
Training Union............................ 6:30 p.m.
Evening Worship........................ 7:00 p.m,

Wednesday
Night Service......................7:30 p m.

Sunday School
Morning Worship............10:30 a.m
Evening Worship........... 6:00 p.m.

Tuesday
Ladies Bible Class..............9:45 a.m.

Wednesday
Night Service......................7:30 p.m.

ST. MARK BAPTIST CHURCH
Jefferson & Martin dale 

Albert Yarborough, Pastor 
Weekly Sunday Services

Sunday School................... 9:45a.m.

METHODIST CHURCH
Jefferson St Rosenfeld 

Rev. E. G. Gilbert
ST. STEVENS BAPTIST CHURCH 

Jefferson St Martindale 
iRev. Vurn C. Martin 

Weekly Sunday ServicesFIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Howardwick. Texas 

874-3762
Frankie Just, Pastor 

Sunday
lay School..................10:00 a.m
ning Worship............11:00 a.m

CHURCH OF THE N AZARENE 
3rd & Hawley 

874-2321
Rev. R.A. Noakes 

Sunday
Sunday School................ a.m
Morning Worship........  11:00
Sunday Bible Study...... 5:30 p.m

,6:00 p.m.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
3rd St Gorst 

Gordon Oglesby 
Sunday

Sunday School.......................... ,10:00 a.m
Morning Worship..............10:55 a.m.
Evening Worship.......................6:00 p.m

United Pentecostal Church
Montgomery A  Faker St. 

874-3756
Lawrence Thompson, Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School...........10 a.m.
Morning Worship.... 11 a.m.
Evening Worship......7:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service............ 7:30 p.m.

Preaching

Prayer Service...,. 
Woman's Mission

Wedneaday
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Rosenfeld A Kearney 

Hubert Bromley, Minister

Worship Evening Worship

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Hedley, Texas 

J. J. Terry, Pastor CHURCH OF CHOICE
W .W . Wilson 

Weekly Sunday Services

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
4th A Parks 

874-3428
Owen McGarity. Pastor 

Sunday
Sunday School..................10:00 a.m,
Morning Worship.............9:00a.m,
Youth Program.................6:00 p.m
Evening Worship.............. 7:00 p.m

ST. MARY'S CATHOLIC CHURCH
McGelland A Montgomery 

Father Carlson
Sunday Morning Mass......12:15 p-nt
Holy Days.......................... 5:00 p.m.

DONLEY COUNTY 
MINISTERIAL ALLIANCE
Meets First Wednesday of 

Every Month at 10:00 a.m. in 
Farmer’s State Bank 

Hospitality RoomFather Carlson of Groom

Dream Donut ShopThe Clarendon Press
Claude Thomas Welding Shop

Allsup's Food StoreJ&W  Lumber Co
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Lalia Lake 
News

By Mary Castaar
Mr. and Mrs. Dorman 

Usrey o f Amarillo visited 
Sunday with his parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. O.L. Usrey.

Mr. and Mrs. F.A. Floyd 
visited Friday in Amarillo 
with Mr. and Mrs. Boner 
Howard.

Mr. and Mrs. Quinn Aten
spent last Monday in 

Memphis.
Mrs. R.O. Nelson spent 

several days last week in 
Dimmitt visiting her daugh­
ter, Mr.’ and Mrs. Dan Petty 
and children. Her grandson, 
Kevin and Dennis returned 
home with her for a few days 
visit. Mrs. Petty came 
Thursday and spent the night 
and carried the boys back 
home Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Harley 
Smith made a buiness trip to 
Shamrock Thursday.

Visitors in the Lacy Noble 
home last week were, 
Marcus Buchanan of Fresno, 
California. Mr. and Mrs. 
John Alarid o f Am arillo, 
Mrs. Olga Hancock o f  
W hitney. Mrs. W ilbur 
Pearcy of Dallas. Mrs. Ruby 
Denton of Groom, Mr. and 
Mrs. E.V. Quattlebalm of 
Clarendon, Lacy Lee Noble of 
Arlington, Yvonnie Belle 
McDaniel.

Mr. and Mrs. J.B . 
McDaniel attended the 
annual rodeo parade in 
Vernon last Wednesday and 
visited with J.B .’s cousins, 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Madden 
and his aunt. Mrs. M.B. 
Rhoads, and their many 
friends.

Mrs. Clarence Ayers 
accompanied her daughter. 
Mr. and Mrs. George Moore 
and Lynette to Albuquerque, 
New Mexico last Friday to 
visit her son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dale Ayers and boys. Mrs. 
Ayers returned home Sun­
day.

Clarence Ayers attended a 
Farm Bureau M eeting in 
Amarillo Friday.

Mrs. Ora Aten, Mike 
Mooney and a friend, Mrs. 
Merle Brotherton both from 
Lockney, visited Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Quinn Aten.

Mrs. Harold Moffitt and 
Andy o f Memphis spent 
Tuesday with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. F.A. Floyd.

Mrs. J.L. Butler and O.D. 
Roberts visited Wednesday 
in Amarillo with their sister, 
Mrs. Carrie Ballew.

Mr. and M rs. Hollis 
Banister helped celebrate his 
mother's 80th birthday in the 
home of their daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Leeper, 
Friday night. All tfie 
Banister children were pre­
sent. Mrs. Banister then 
returned home with,her son, 
the Hollis Banisters, for the 
weekend.

Mr. and M rs. L.B. 
Leathers and girls visited in 
Amarillo Friday morning 
with Mrs. Leather's uncle, 
J.N. Weaver, a patient in St. 
Anthonys Hospital. Mr. and 
Mrs. Leathers went onto 
Amherst to spend the 
weekend with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lige Griffin, 
and visited with her 
sister-in-law, Mrs. Eugene 
Griffin and children, while 
there.

Mrs. Violet McNabb^nd 
grandchildren o f  Am anllo 
spent Saturday night with 
her brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
Hollis Banister.

Teeny Woods o f Good­
night spent Sunday night 
with Paula Helms.

Mr. and Mrs. Kennith 
Wesson of Geronimo, Okla­
homa visited Sunday evening 
with |iis uncle, Mr- and Mrs. 
R.D. Castner. and Cathy.

Mrs. Lacy Noble shopped 
and visited in Amarillo 
Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Theron 
Holland had lunch Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 
Shields. Other Sunday 
visitors were Mrs. Shields’ s 
neice, Irene M oss of 
Amarillo, and Don Springer 
and children o f Hedley.

Mr. and Mrs. Lester Carol 
and Kathy of Amarillo visited 
Sunday with his father, Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Myers.

Glenn Myers and John 
O'Neal attended the track 
meet in Canyon Firday and 
brought home several rib­
bons. Glen placed second in 
the 50 yard dash, first in the 
standing high jump and first 
in the standing broad jump. 
Congratulations Glen and 
John.

Mr. and Mrs. A.L. Thomas 
had their sons home over the 
week end. Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd Thomas of Hereford 
spent the week end, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Thomas also of 
Herford, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Thomas and children 
of Pimmitt visited Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 
Dishman visited Sunday in 
Canyon with Mary and Slim 
Chenauh, and Mrs. Dish- 
man's brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
W.C. Debord.

Kari Shields spent *he 
week end with her grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
George Shields.

Mr. and Mrs. Greg 
Bowling o f Amarillo visited 
over the week end with Mr. 
and Mrs. Carson Bowling 
and girls and Mr. and Mrs. 
J.H. Bowling.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Leathers and children o f  
McLean spent the week end 
with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J.R. Leathers.

Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Barrow 
o f Amarillo visited Saturday 
morning with his brother. 
Mr. and Mrs. Nolan Barrow.

Mr. and Mrs. R.D. 
Castner visited Sunday night 
in Memphis with his sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Clayton.

Don’t forget Community 
Center Saturday night. May 
10, at 7 p.m. Everyone is 
invited. Bring a covered 
dish. H ostesses will be 
Barbara Helms and Mrs. 
Pauline Koontx.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete 
Wortham visited Saturday in 
Groom with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Buster Painter.

Calvary Baptist 
Will Honor 
Mothers

Sunday May 11th, there 
will be a special Mothers day 
present for every Mother 
present at 10:00 o ’ clock 
Sunday morning. Lets honor 
out Mothers by being in 
Church this Lords day, come 
and bring your friends. 
There will be a Special gift 
for the Oldest Mother 
present this Sunday, also 
there will be a speejal gift for 
the youngest Mother pre­
sent. and there will be a 
special gift for the Mother 
with the largest number of 
children present.

Monday evening May 12th 
will be the beginning of the 
Tri State Fellowship meet­
ing. there will be a special 
speaker for the Monday 
evening service, services will 
be gin at 7:30 p.m. there will 
be special singing and 
special music. Also Tuesday 
May 13th there will be 
special services beginning at 
10:00 a.m. and continuing 
until 3:00 p.m. Lunch will be 
served at the noon hour by 
the Calvary Baptist Church,, 
every one is invited to attend 
these services, there will be 
Churches represented from 
all over the panhandle area, 
also from Oklahoma and 
Kansas. C offee and 
Doughnuts will be served by 
the Calvary Baptist Church 
from nine until ten o ’clock 
Tuesday morning, May the 
13th come and enjoy a fine 
time of fellowship with us.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Ward of Lelia Lake visited 
his Grandparents Mr. and 
Mrs. W.C. Ragen Sunday.

SPECTACULAR 
SEALY SALE

rf>s,
r , „

Nationally
advertised

The Sealy Posture Lok 
Supreme, Nationally adver- 

led In Better Homes *  
Gardens, Is NOW on Sale. 
This Is a limited time offer. 
So Don't be disappointed.

Full Size 
Each Piece 

Queen Size
2 Piece Set

King Size
3 Piece Set

*79** 
*199’* 
*279’*

•a . pc.
Twin Six*

OSBURNS
FURNITURE 

AND APPLIANCE

Religious Thoughts
by JAMES O. BRANDON

Visiting the sick is the personal task o f every member of 
society. There comes a time in everyon’s life when it becomes 
his personal responsibility to pay a visit to a sick loved one, 
friend, or neighbor. One o f the things mentioned by Jesus 
which will be brought out on the Judgment Day is the visiting 
o f the sick. Jesus said: " . . .I  was sick and ye visited m e...”  
(Matt. 25:36;.

It is especially the Christian duty to visit the sick. The 
church member has a responsibility toward another person. 
The Bible indicates one of the times Mat we are to take 
advantage to do our Christian duty is wtben another person 
becomes ill.

The question arises: How do we visit the sick? How are we 
supposed to do it? What are we to say? How long are we to 
stay? Following are some simple guidelines in following:

Realize that a sick person faces more than physical 
weakness and pain. They are away from their home. Life has 
changed for them. The emotional tramma is often more 
serious than the physical problem.

Check at the Nurses’ station; introduce yourself; inquire of 
the condition of the person; ask if visitors are permitted. The 
idea of a visit to a sick person in the hospital is to help the 
individual not to hurt him. If he is not to have visitors, then 
this request o f the doctor needs to be heard.

In the hospital room, do not neglect others in the same 
room with the person you went to see even if you are not 
acquainted with them. Be friendly with the others while 
concentrating upon the person whom you went to see.

It is good to knock at the door o f a hospital room before 
entering. Do not enter when the doctor is with the patient. 
The consulation is a private concern.

Once you are with the person you wish to visit, take his 
hand if it is extended. If he does not extend his hand, it may 
be that he is too weak to deso. Don’t insist. Be Chatty. Don’t 
be gloom. The person in the bed has enough o f this while he 
is in the hospital. If you are all tearful, you visit doesn’t help. 
Be joyful. Be prayerful. It wouldn’t hurt for you to pray for 
the individual. The person will appreciate. Don’t stay all 
day.

If the person you go to see is unconscious, don’t talk o f his 
death; or say. “ He is on his way out;”  or “ That’ s too bad;”  
and etc. Even though the individual is unconscious, he can 
hear you. We are told that the hearing o f an individual even if
he is unconscious is very accute.

Don’t neglect your personal responsibility to say to a 
friend, neighbor, or loved one when ill that you appreciate 
them. Show them that you do. Go visit with them.

Baptist Will Present Movie School Menu
There will be a special 

full-length movie presented 
by the Baptist Student Union 
of Clarendon College for the 
entire public. This movie is 
Entitiled: “ My Son, My 
Son" and will be showing on 
Thursday. May 8th, at 8:30 
p.m. in the auditorium of 
First Baptist Church.

“ My Son, ‘My Son,”  is a 
true story. The anguished 
true story o f famous writer 
Bernard Palmer who, in the 
book by the same title, laid 
bare the facts about his 
relationship with his son, 
Barry. Busy as a writer, his 
very soul immersed in 
Christian service, Berriie 
hardly realized what was 
happening to his son. Until it 
was nearly too late.

Now in a m agnificent, 
intensely-m oving motion 
picture, the story o f Bernard 
Palmer, his wife Marge and 
their son Barry come into 

enetrating reality. It is a

tragic story, as come assess 
success and failure. But it is 
also triumphant.

Barry’s mother died when 
the boy was young, and he 
could not cope with a 
stepmother and the other 
children who joined  the 
fam ily. Bad conduct at 
school, scrapes with the law, 
heartache after heartache- 
all took their toll on family 
relationships.

“ My Son, My S on " 
detonates a powerful mes­
sage for parents. Already 
one o f  the most widely 
hearlded evangelical films, 
its ministry has been God’s 
tool for changing lives-and 
families. You will not want 
to miss this great movie.

Mrs. Grace Markham of 
Amarillo visited her mother 
Mrs. Susan Ashcraft and 
sister Emma Saturday.

Monday jte
Bar-B-Que beef, creamed >• 

potatoes, buttered spinach, 
homemade bread, pineapple 
cake, and milk.

Tuesday
Burritos with cheese, 

buttered corn, lettuce and 
tomatoes, banana pudding, 
and milk.

Wednesday 1
Beef stew with vegetables, 

cole slaw, cheese stick, 
corn bread, fruit jello, and 
milk.

Thursday
Hot dog with chili on 

homemade bun, tossed 
green salad, baked beans, 
and milk.

Friday
Sloppy Joe on bun, lettuce 

and tomatoes, french fries, 
apple pie, and milk.

j ^ i b l e S
N r Mothar

DON STONE 874-2495
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I- Monday —  -m  L  l
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The
The Market Place

Please check ad carefully the first l 
of error, The Press will not ass urn

This reserves the right to reject any ad if f 
and also to correctly classify any ad for I

FOR SALE: NEW 3 bedroom 
brick house. Double garage, 
central heat, refrigerated air, 
carpeted thru out, 2 fujl 
Baths, built-in kitchen. 150 
Ft. frontage lot. Financing 
available. Ed or Mary 
Sawyer 806-874-3664.

23-tfc

Agricultural

WANT TO LEASE 
GRASSLAND 
James Hefley 

779-3134 
Boa 42

McLean, Texas 79057
3-9-tfc

For Sale

FOR SALE AKC Toy poodles 
874-2420. Anytime.

Rentals

Warehouse A  Private office 
space for rent. Available 
May 1st. Approxim ately 
1,700 sq. ft. Open area all 
utilities furnished, central air 
and heat. Large everhead 

. 874-3!14-tfc door excess -3541.

For Sale New 16”  Zenith 
color T.V. and stand. Oneta 
Sanders 874-2533.

24-tf

15-3tc

Standing at stud-registered
QUARTER HORSE. Bay 
stallion by 1961 W orld 
Champion BREEZE BAR 
out of TOP BRACKETT AA 
ROM mare. Pete Bromley 
Clarendon, Texas (806) 
874-3827.

24-6tc

For Sale: 100 egg portable 
hatcher, metal desk, call 
874-3541 or after 6 874-2302.

For Sale: Jayco fold down 
camper trailer - sleeps 8 with 
kitchen. Like new. Call Glenn 
Wallace 874-2251.

-  16-tfc

For sale 1970 8X35 mobile 
home. 2 bdrm. clean. Also 
Starcraft camper. Hollie E. 
Byers, H edley, Texas 
856-3461.

15-tfc

For Sale: Tomatoe plants for 
sale. Jiggs Land, Lelia Lake. 
Call after 3 p.m. 874-3668.

16-ltc

For rent: 3 room unfurnished 
apartment. 874-2281.

16-tfc

For Sale - Nearly new electric 
range with se lf cleaning 
oven. Fully automatic. Call 
874-3927 after 5.

16-ltp

For Sale: Good condition 
1971 Chevrolet pickup. Bill 
Montgomery - Brice Route 
Garendon, Texas 79226.

16-ltp

For Sale: John Deere deep 
furrow drill. Tandem Disk 12 
ft. 4 row Moline Tractor. Call 
944-3233.

16-3tp

F encing.. 4 ,5 ,6  foot chain 
link. Materials only, or 
installed. Call or write for 
estimates. 806-259-2742, 
P.O . Box 67, M em phis, 
Texas 79245, 102 Boykin 
Drive.

16-tfc

Real Estate
HOUSE FOR SALE: 620 S. 
McLain. 3 ‘A lots, storm 
cellar, 2 bedroom. Contact 
Robert Partain, Rt. 1, 
Garendon.

___________________  8-tfc
For Sale: One full block of 
land located on the east edge 
o f Clarendon. Has city 
water, sewer and gas. Ideal 
for mobile home. Has been 
planted in feesque grass. 
Fenced and small barn. Call 
874-2530.

16-2tc

9 Unit Motel with living 
quarters in Garendon, would 
trade for dwelling as part 
payment in Wichita Falls or 
Quanah. Coffee Ins. A Real 
Estate A gency. Inc. 
817-551-9951

16-7tc
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t Place
-Phone 874-3541

The Country Store, Gaude, 
Texas is wanting to enter the 
field o f residential construc­
tion. Ed Flanagan, manager 
is looking for someone with 
the ability to function as the 
general contractor who 
would prefer to work without 
financial exposure. Interest­
ed parties may contact Mr. 
Flanigan by writing to the 
store at P.O. Box 318 Gaude, 
Texas 79019 or call 806-226- 
2621.

16-2tc

FOR RENT: Modern two bed 
, room duplex apartment. Call 

Bob Bell 874-3915 or 
874-2576.

25-tfc

FOR RENTt nice clean 
modern duplex apartment. 
Contact Jack Clifford.

19-tfc

Furnished apta. bills paid. 
874-2332

16-tfc

Card of Thanks

I wish to thank each and 
everyone who contributed to 
the delicious meal served to 
the Swinburn family on 
Monday April 28 at the 
Brandon home.

Johanna and Stephen 
Swinburn

16-ltc

I pray that God will reward 
our wonderful friends Mr. 
and Mrs. Marvin Jones, and 
Mr. and Mrs. J.R. Brandon 
for their kindness during our 
recent bereavement.

Johanna and Stephen 
Swinburn

16-ltc

FOR RENT
It’ * inexpensive to clean rugs 
and upholstery with Blue 
Lustre. Rent and electric 
Shampooer SI .00. Goodman 
Furniture.

16-ltc

TUNEUPS—MUFFLER 
Or

MAJOR OVERHAUL 
O a-Ik -F am  Service 

STEVE’S AUTOMOTIVE 
k INDUSTRIAL 

323 S. Keeney 874-3446 
Clarendon, Texas

* * * * * * * * * * * * * *  
EXTERIOR and INTERIOR
Painting • Free Estimates 

Call 259-28131 

B, G, HILL
* * * * * * * * * * * * * *

RHODE PIPE CO.
Bex 747

i [886] 823-2458

A ll

823-2149
'(806]

823-2247
(886]

TV Sets For Rent. Inquire at 
Henson’ s.

3-tfc

Our business la complete, 
efficient car sendee. We 
dean the glass...sweep eat 
the car...check the radiator 
and hoses...the fan belt 
and tires. We keep yea 
informed about the condi­
tion of potential trouble 
spots, where neglect can be 
dangerous.

CORNELL TEXACO
SERVICE STATION

3 0 ^ V ^ n d ^ 7 £ 3 4 4 1  
s— — ■■■euaaMMMawMe*
Typewriters - Calculators 

Adding Machines- 
ROY M. HORN 
TYPEWRITER 

REPAIR SERVICE 
171015th St.

Wellington, Texas 79095

Look Who's 
New

Tonya Denise Brandt, 7 
lbs. 8 1/4 ozs. was born in 
the New Palo Duro hospital 
in Canyon, May 3, daughter 
o f Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Brandt of 4808 Westway in 
Amarillo.

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Truett Hall of 
Garendon. Paternal grand­
parents is Mr. and Mrs. 
Dennis Brandt o f  Rt. 1 
Garendon.

Mrs. Brandt is the former 
Truetta Hall of Garendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Milton 
Havens are the parents o f a 
son, John Lee, born May 1, 
at Lampasas.

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Hutson of 
Garendon. Paternal grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Arther Havens o f Garendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
McLaughlin of Bric^ Route 
announce the birth of a son 
Louis Edward McLaughlin 

3.{fc  Jr. He arrived April 23 at 
_ _  4:41 a.m. and weighed 6 lbs.

and 2 oz.

Father-son 
Bar-B-Que

The annual Father-son- 
Businessmen chicken Bar- 
B-Que will be held Tuesday , 
May 13, at 7:30 p.m. in the 
high school cafeteria. 
Special recognition and 
honors will be presented to 
the F.F.A. members.

CONNIE’S 
RADIO & TV 

REPAIR
Phone 874-3752

Miscellaneous.
Wanted: Lawns to mow after 
school and on Saturdays. Call 
Mike 874-2039.

16-2tc

Night Help Wanted: Prefer 
male. 11:00 p.m. to 7:00 a.m. 
6 days a week. Must be able 
to take polygraph test. Call 
874-9977, or go by Allsups 
and talk to manager.

16-ltc

W anted horses to break 
874-2248.

16-2tp

Garage Sale Friday and 
Saturday - May 9 and 10th. 
7th and Johns. Everything 
reduced.

16-ltp

Cuatom Harvesting would 
appreciate your business. 
Small acreage or large. Call 
259-3474, Memphis, Texas, 
8:30 a.m. or 10:00 p.m.

16-ltp

Free • German shepard pups 
2 fem ale, 1 male. 
Deworm ed. Need good 
hom e. Across from 
Deeprock station.

____________________ 16-ltp

EXTRA LONG 108-inch 
traditional sofa and chair for 
sale. Excellent condition. See 
at Osburn Furniture. 
_______________________19-tfc

Will build cellars in 
Garendon. Call Loyd Ford.

15-8tc

RAY APPLIANCE SERVICE

General Electric Franchise Dealer 
Heating and Air Conditioning 

We service all makes of Air Conditioning 
Freezer and Refrigeration 

Service & Repairs 
D.P. RAY, owner 

Clarendon, Texas 874-3801

Rattan's TV Sonrico & Salas
Your Zenith Dealer

DENNIS RATTAN TEX NAYLOR

874-3570 Main Street

OFFICE SUPPLIES
Shop with One Stop for every need.

Come In and browse. New merchandise arriving dally 
Including fineat In Office Furniture.

CLARENDON OFFKE SUPPLY A PRMTMO
201 S. Kearney ..Phone 874-2043...Clarendon, Tex. 

Mr. and Mr*. G. W. Eatlack, Owner* A Operator*

Wanted - yard work after 
school and on Saturdays 
874-2506.

15-2tp

“ CONFIDENTIAL Care for 
pregnant unwed mothers. 
EDNA GLADENY HOME, 
2308 Hemphill, Fort Worth. 
Texas. Toll free number 
l-IJpO-792-1104.”

------------------------------------ 4-tfcs

BEFORE YOU arrange to 
finance your new or late 
model car, compare my new 
low cost finance rates. I can 
•eve you money.

Emmett 0 . Simmons 
at the Farmers State Bank 

3-tfc

BU Y YO UBIN SUR AN CI
FROM A

LOCAL INDEPENDENT AGENT 
OUR INTEREST IS YOU 

SERVICE TO YOU IS FIRST 
FIRE CASUALTY AUTO LIFE 

HOME LOANS

S I
310 s EMMETT SIMMONS *74-350#

We W ant YourH oute Insurance
WE have established ourselves as an agency 
who cares for our customers. . .
WE want to become your Agent. Check with us 
on our rates, and with our customers for 
service.

Walt Knnrpp 
[Todd Knnrpp 

874-3521

Knoppp
Jbtt u A o H c e

$30 to $50 more 
per calf with 
Charolais bulls

B re d  a n d  raised fo r this a re a - 
R e a d y  to  u se  C o m e  b y  s o o n  

Jloffi Bvtlor
• 7 4 - 3 7 3 2

Card nf Thanks

We .wish to express our 

thanks to our many friends 

for the cards, flowers, food, 

and prayers, and expressions 
o f kindness during our loss.

The family of 
J.L. James

* * * * * * * * * * * *  
H *J OIL COMPANY 

Harvle DBA June 
Track Stop 

Super Service 
CarWash

Home 874-3589 874-9980
*  * * * * * * * * * * * *  
me

RM 66 SERVICE 
874-2155

Gaaollne, Oil, Tires, Batter­
ies I  Accessories.

FOR SALE
2 A  3 Bedroom Houses 

Listings Wanted 
Sanders Real Estate 

820 S. Allen 
874-2533

T V  Cable Service
THREE

CLEAR CHANNELS 
Plus FM  Music and 

Continuous Wnather Scan 
On Channel 6 

For Information and 
Service Call 874-3570 

OF CLARENDON
CABLE T V

OF CLARENDON

Contact :

New Cars
1974 GMC pickup purchased 
by Steve Bryant, Amarillo 
from Chamberlain Motor 
Company.

1975 Cadillac purchased, 
by C.O. Kersey, Amarillo 
from Chamberlain Motor 
Company.

1975 GMC pickup pur­
chased by J.A. Williams. 
Stinnett from Chamberlain 
Motor Company.

1976 Cadillac purchased 
by Genevieve Jones, Garen­
don from Chamberlain Motor 
Company.

1975 Olds purchased by 
C .W . Shattuck, Shamrock 
from Chamberlain Motor 
Company.

1975 Cadillac purchased 
by Mrs. John M obley, 
Pampa from Chamberlain 
Motor Company.

1975 Pontiac purchased bv 
Earl Dodson, Clarendon from 
Chamberlain Motor Com- . 
pany.

1975 Pontiac purchased by 
Garvin H. Speed, Childress 
from Chamberlain Motor 
Company.

1975 Holiday Rambler 
Travel Trailer purchased by 
L.L. Wallace from Camper 
Roundup, Amarillo.

1975 Chevrolet truch van 
purchased by T.J. Campbell 
of Clarendon from Alderson 
Chevrolet.

1975 Chevrolet purchased 
by Frank Reid of Garendon 
from Alderson Chevrolet.

Scout Camporee to 
be Held at Greenbelt

A District Camporee will 
be held at the Greenbelt Lake 
Staurday. May 10th beginn­
ing at 1 p.m.

Contests between Troops 
will be held in the afternoon 
and a campfire that evening. 
Ribbons will be awarded 
winners and patches for the 
participating Troopers.

All Scouts from Troop 33 
will meet at the Christian 
Church at 11 a.m. Saturday. 
Bring a sack lunch for dinner 
and supper.

We will need transporta­
tion for the boys.

Each Scout will need a 4 
foot piece of rope (small 
about 3 /8  inch)

Competion will be on the 
patrol bases. Not less than 4 
boys or more than 8 to patrol.

Little League News
The First baseball game 

this season wilt be Saturday, 
May 10th at 7:30 p.m. The 
Clarendon Babe Ruth Team 
will travel to Skellytown to 
play White Deer-Skellytown. 
Clarendon will then host 
Claude, Tuesday May 13, 
7:30 p.m.

The Clarendon Little 
League will open its season 
May 26. with the Cubs facing 
the Yankees. A complete 
schedule will be available 
next week. The players draft 
meeting for the Little League 
teams will be held Monday, 
May 12, 8:00, at Garendon 
College. Work day is 
scheduled for Saturday May 
17th. Teams may begin 
practice May 13.

I  Colts Corral
Hello everyone! Welcome to ’ ’Colt Country" once again!
W e’re all through with our "school sports" for the 74-75 

year, but lots of the guys (and a few brave girls) are really 
excited about baseball, which is just starting. Batter up!!

On Thursday, we all assembled in the old gym for a 
program by the choir. We would like to thank Miss S. and her 
students for that wonderful program! It was great!!

The band is looking forward to the music festival which will 
take place at the college a week from tomorrow. Those 
unlucky creatures who are playing solos and/or ensembles 
are really gettin’ nervous! Good luck, everyone!!

W e’re sorry to hear that Terry and Jerry W. are leavin’ us 
so soon. We hope they like it at their new home!

Well, ft seems that even though Gwen E. is in Ft. Worth, 
she’ s still updated. Right, Teresa H. and Dan B.??

_  Kim Me., who’s that "tall, dark, and handsom”  you’ve 
been seen with lately?

Becky H., they say twice is a charm, but really!
Renee C., You’d better get busy cleaning up all those 

desks!
Susan Molder, do you enjoy backing Johnny S. into the 

corner?
Dee Ann C. and Teresa H., "Please don’t drown me! 

Please!”
Phillip M. and Theresa S. look cute together. Hans in 

there! *
Jeanie L., Mark W., Janna B., and Dink S. sure had fun 

sticking each other in the corner in Math, but now (sob!) 
they’re separated.

Laronda H., who was walking you down the hall?
Alan S.. Rick H. knows that Coach B. loves you!!
And, now, we leave you with this proverb from Coach H.:
"Silence is golden.
Unsilence is red!”

A n g l i n
J M o fn f • TAX OFFICE

For Bondod • 
Termite & Roach; 

Control
by Qualified Firm? 

Phone 874-2438?

m  SHOWING
fo r  Solo

After Hears
874-3676
874-3686

Make PLANS Now
For Those Necessan Repair and Remodeling Jobs 

With M A T ER IA LS  From 
Foxworth-Galbraith Lumber Co.

LLeyd McCord, Mgr. 
381 E. 2nd. 874-3334 », Ta

Girl Scout Troop News

Girl Scout Troop #113 met 
Thursday, May 1, "at the 
home o f  M rs. Barbara 
Cosper.

The girls discussed the 
recent camporee and made 
plans for a party.

Attending were Renee 
Cosper, Jamie M cAnear, 
Lori Tucker, Starla Mann, 
Adenia Mills, Kim Moore, 
Debbie Johnston, Gina Land, 
Theresa Shields, and Kellie 
Sanders.

The next meeting will be 
May 7, in the Scout room.

The Brownies Troop 95 
will have a weiner roast and 
home made ice cream with a 
pin and badge ceremony at 
the City park May 8 at 7:00 
p.m.

Fourteen Brownies will be 
honored, they are, Melissa 
Johnson, Mary Kathrine 
Hayes, Pish Robinson, Amy 
Hancock, Gayla C lifford, 
Susan M osley, Rebecca 
Sowers, Kay Diahn Bell, Kim 
Formway, Kim Campbell, 
Christina Jarmillo, Regina 
Phillips, Zandra Edwards, 
and Shellie Hicks. Leaders 
are Mrs. Paul Hancock, Mrs. 
Jim Robinson. Mrs. Paul 
Bell.

There will be ceremonial 
indian dancing by Farrell 
Shelton. Guest will be 
parents and relatives.

April 25-27, 1975, was the 
Advanced Junior Camporee 
at Camp Mel Davis, Lefors, 
Texas. Fifteen girls from 
Troop 175 attended. They

are as follow s: Karen 
Alderson, Tonya Brad dock, 
Rhonda Butler, June Asher, 
Jackie Gardner, Donna 
Johnston, Angela Klinnert, 
Karen Kotara, Vanessa 
Calloway, Angelia Gardner, 
Stephanie Johnson, Tana 
Gunnels. Sala Leffew, Lacre- 
cia Petty, Tammy Sanders. 
Sponsors were: Mrs. Gene 
Alderson and Mrs. .Jim 
Braddock, and Cadette 
Scout, Ellen Green.

Friday night camp was set 
up. Saturday the contests 
began at 9:30 a.m. They 
included knot tying, lashing 
first aid. knife handling, fire 
building, signaling and 
compass. They ended at 
12:15. Just-for-fun contests 
were also held in frisbee 
throwing, bubble blowing- 
(gum ), giggling and cow 
calling. Saturday evening at 
dusk, a ceremony was held to 
rem em ber the cam pfire 
Juliette Low, Founder, had 
with the Girl Scouts from the 
United States and Girl 
Guides from all over the 
world.

At the Camp Mel Davis 
campfire, awards were given 
out. Troop 17S placed 5th in 
the main contests, and won 
2nd place in the Frisbee 
Throw. The troop earned the 
Songster badge while at 
camp.

Sunday morning a worship 
service was held, camp 
broken and the troop headed 
for Garendon.

Soil Stewardship week

Card of Thanks

I would like to thank my

many friends for the cards, 

flowers and calls during my

stay in the hospital.

P.C. Messer

Donley County and State 
office advice deadline for 
hom estead exem ptions is 
May 10. Residents o f Donley 
County are required to sign 
State homestead exemptions 
to maintain tax exemption.

At a time when pressures 
grow on the land, it is useful 
to remind ourselves of the 
origins and history o f the Soil 
Stewardship observance. 
They stress the allegiance of 
all men to God and their 
dependence on His grace for 
all good things. %

Throughout the ages, men 
have offered humble thanks 
to their Creator for the 
priceless gifts of air, soil, 
water, and sunshine which 
make all living things 
possible.

The custom o f setting 
aside special days 
Rogation Days -  for this 
purpose began more than 
1,500 years ago in the 
neighborhood o f Vienne, 
France. Bad weather and 
earthquakes had brought 
crop failures and widespread 
hunger. The Bishop o f 
Vienne call for prayer and 
penance on the three days 
proceding Ascension Day. 
The people responded and 
implored God for help in 
their suffering and privation.

W ord o f  what had 
happened in Vienne spread 
throughout France -  and 
then to other countries. The 
supplication filled a need in 
the hearts and minds o f the 
people, and as the years 
went by. Rogation Days were 
widely observed as a annual 
custon. By the end of the 
eighth century, the Church 
formally adopted the custom. 
Now, the world over, people 

on Rogation Days beg the 
mercy of God and ask that He 
spare His Children the evils 
of soul and body »  and give 
good increase to the plants of 
the field.

In our own land it has met 
an evident need of the people 
to set aside a week each year 
to acknowledge before God 
our gratitude for His gifts o f 
soil and all the bountiful 
resources associated with it.

In Am erica, the soil 
stewardship observance has 
always traced its origins to 
the Rogation Days. 
Throughout parts o f the

South, earlier in this century, 
churches and their congre­
gations began to set aside 
the fifth Sunday after Easter 
as Soil and Soul Sunday.

Subsequently, this became 
Soil Stewardship Sunday 
when, in 1946. the publishers 
of Farm and Ranch magazine 
suggested to religious lead­
ers in a few southern states 
that one Sunday be set aside 
each year to remind their 
congregations of man’ s duty 
to be a good steward of the 
land.

The response of clergymen 
and laymen was so warm and 
widespread that observance 
of Soil Stewardship Sunday 
spread steadily to additional 
states. In 1954, the 
publishers o f the magazine 
suggested to the officers of 
the National Association of 
Conservation Districts that a 
still wider observance of Soil 
Stewardship Sunday could 
aid signigicantly in bringing 
about a national awakening 
and resognition o f man’ s 
obligations to the Lord’ s 
earth. The publishers 
offered to relinquish their 
limited sponsorship of Soil 
Stewardship Sunday to the 
Association — which repre­
sents some 3,000 local soil 
and water conservation 
d i s t r i c t  o r g a n i z a t i o n s  
throughout America.

The Association accepted, 
and beginning in 1955 
undertook to encourage a 
nation-wide observance -  a 
mission to which it has 
dedicated itself ever since, 
under the guidance of a 
special Soil Stewardship 
Advisory Committee o f 
c l e rg y m e n  re prese nti ng  
many o f  the country's 
religious denominations. In 
1956. recognizing possible 
conflicts with the observance 
of Rural Life Sunday, which 
was on the calendar of many 
churches. Soil Stewardship 
Sunday was changed to Soil 
Stewardship Week »  begin­
ning with the fifth Sunday 
after Easter and, continuing 
through the sixth.
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SEE FOR YOURSELF W HY LOTS O f PEOPLE DRIVE A  

UTILE TO SAVE A  LOT! MORE THAN 150 NEW 1975 
MODELS IN  STOCK W ITH A  DELKHTFUL REPRESENTATION 

OF GENERAL MOTOR'S LIIXHRY MODELS... WE HAVE IT 
ALL... LUXURY, PRICE, SERVICE AND SELECTION!

CHAMBERLAIN MOTOR
COMPANY
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