
I f  *  check appears by your nam 
paper has expired. Subscription 
for Donley County are $13.00 and 
outside the county and out o f state

$16-60. Mall to Box 1110, Clarendon, 
Texas 79226.

USPS 947040

Highlights on the insiditlUM
H e d ley  b a s e b a l l ... 

s e e  p a g e  5

F a rm e r  and

R a n ch er m ee tin g  ... 
s e e  p a g e  6

8th g ra d e
g ra d u a tio n  ...

s e e  p a g e  8

The Clarendon Press
Dedicated To Fair And Impartial Representation

Serving Hedley, Clarendon and Howardwick Thursday, jane 9,1900 Number 23 40c

A.J. Locksmith 
Service opens 
new business c

A.J. Locksmith Service is one of 
Clarendon’s newest businesses. It is 
own* d by Jerry Holman and his wife, 
Judy. The Holman’s moved to Clar­
endon from California. Jerry,' a 
native ot the Panhandle area being 
born in Borger, is the 
second generation locksmith and is 
prouc to offer Donley County this 
serviie.

Jirry states, ‘ ‘ It is the commit­
ment o f A.J. Locksmith Service to 
provide prompt, courteous service, 
and practical solutions to all o f your 
security questions and needs.”

A.J. Locksmith Service also pro­
vides 24 hour emergency service and 
a ten percent discount for senior 
citizens, residential and auto.

Jerry suggests for the safety and 
protection of yourself and loved ones 
that you inspect your security fix­
tures in your home and auto. If they 
are not working smoothly, they 
should be checked to avoid a possible 
lockout. Also, are your security 
fixtures adequate for the properties 
they protect. It can take years o f hrd 
hard work to acquire what you won 
and only minutes to lose them 
through faulty or inadequate security 
fixtures.

At the present, Jerry works out of 
his home but he can be contacted by 
calling 874-5016.

S u m m e r  fitn e s s  
a n d  re c re a tio n

p ro g ra m  a t  CHS

Beginning Monday. June 13th the 
summer fitness and recreation pro­
gram will start at the field house in 
Bronco Stadium.

The program will be divided into 
two sessions. Starting at 1 p.m. to 4 
p.m. All boys and girls who will be in 
the sixth thru eighth grades ar 
einvited to participate in the activity 
programs. Starting at 6 p.m. to 10 all 
high school students in grades 9-12 
are encouraged to participate int he 
activity program.

We will have this program Monday 
thru Friday until July 18. Activties 
will include weight traing, flag 
football, basketball, volleyball, soft- 
ball and a running program.

Friends of the 
Library book sale 

and silent auction
Only one week remains before the 

Used Book Sale and Silent Auction 
comes to an end! Be sure to go by the 
Library to see the Silent Auction 
items and place your bids, every­
thing from wildflower prints to a 
beautiful brass duck is on display to 
be sold for the benefit of the Burton 
Memorial Library. The Used Book 
Sale begins Thursday, June 16 
upstairs at the Library with the 
Preview Party from 5-7 p.m. It 
continues on Friday, June 17 ont he 
side* alk in front of the Library from 
10 a.m. until 4 p.m.

Final bids on Silent Auction items 
will be taken at 4 p.m. Plan to be a 
part o f the fun!

Tommie Saye 
Cooperative Observer 
for National Weather 
Sen Ice, Clarendon

Day Date HI low Predp.
Monday 30 80 61 .01
Tuesday 31 82 64 .10
Wednesday 1 76 57 1.12
Thursday 2 80 55 T
Friday 3 89 58
Saturday 4 82 58
Sunday 5 84 52

Total Moisture for month 1.12
Totni for year 7 ->r>

JERRY HOLMAN

Booth space available for

Country Craft Fair July 4th

Once again the Donley County 4-H 
Gubs are sponsoring the Country 
Craft Fair, held on the courthouse 
lawn on July 4, 1988.

Booth space is available for $10.00 
per space, and the 4-H’ers will 
receive all the proceeds from the 
rentals.

To reserve your space, contact the 
County Extension Office at 874-2141. 
There will be someone there in the 
mornings, but the office does close at

noon. The only guarantee is that your 
booth will be located on the court­
house lawn, we cannot promise you 
that you will have shade. To insure 
that you will have shade, perhaps 
you might bring a tractor or patio 
umbrella, tarp, or something else 
that can be put up to provide shade.

You are not guaranteed a booth 
until we receive the $10.00 booth 
rental fee. and any booths will be 
rented on a first come, first served 
basis.

DENISE AND RON MUNSON and daughter Nicole

Ron Muson Superior Livestock 
Auction local representative

Superior Livestock Auction has a 
new representative living in Lelia 
Lake. Ron Munson. Ron is no 
stranger to this area. He was raised 
at Boys Ranch and attended Garen- 
don College where he received an 
Associate Degree in Ranch and 
Feedlot Management. Ron’s wife, 
Denise, works with Ron two days a 
week at Amarillo Livestock and at a 
boot shop in Amarillo. Ron and 
Denise also have a 6 month old 
daughter, Nicole.

Superior Livestock Auction is a 
merger of two pioneer livestock video 
auctions. Odle Auctions of Bruch, 
Colorado and Amarillo Livestock 
Video Auction of Amarillo, Texas. 
During 1986 the video cattle auctions 
were conducted as Odle Auctions and 
were holding successful video auc­

tions until the merger in January 
1987. This new method of marketing 
livestock was developed for conduct­
ing auction sales using communica­
tion satellite and expanding the sales 
to anyone who has access to a 
satellite receiving disk.

As a representative, Ron will be 
present at each delivery and make 
sure the livestock shipped fits the 
contract. All livestock is sold F.O.B. 
in load lots of 450,000 pounds 
minimum.

Ron and Denise are living in the 
Butler Home in Lelia Lake. They 
would like to hear from interested 
persons about the auction and 
extends a warm welcome to anyone 
that would like to drop by their home 
or call 874-3116.

Old Fashioned Day at 
Calvary Baptist Church
This Sunday, June 12, is old 

Fashioned Day at the Calvary Baptist 
Church. The day will start o ff at 
10:00 a.m. We will be having a 
special Sunday School and Church 
service inside. After the morning 
service we will be going outside for 
dinner, games and an afternoon 
service.

We will be having some good ole 
West Texas B.B.Q. chicken cooked 
up on a pit B.B.Q. There will be pony 
rides, hay rides, washer tosses, 
horseshoe throws, sack races, tug-o- 
war contests and much more.

Dan Hall. Mack & Judy Garrison 
and Sharyn Morrow will be bringing 
some old fashioned gospel quartet

music There will also be an old 
fashioned message from our Pastor.

We want to invite everyone to 
come and join us on this special day 
and be sure to wear your old 
fashioned duds

Lelia Lake

Community Center

Lelia Lake Community Center will 
have their covered dish supper 
Saturday. June 11, 1988 starting at 
7:00 p.m.

“Beautiful Bodies” - Fitness is

Your Fitness Is Our Business could 
be the slogan for another new 
business in Garendon, ‘ ‘ Beautiful 
Bodies” . This new business will be 
having an Open House Friday, June 
10th and is located above Bivens 
Pharmacy.

Over the last few years, passive 
exercise has proved to be the answer 
to body fitness problems for thous­
ands of busy people.

Over the last few years, passive 
exercise has proved to be the answer 
to body fitness for thousands of busy 
people.

Beautiful Bodies is owned by 
Richard and Lana Grisham and is 
managed by their daughter DeeVee.

DeeVee states, “ muscles in the 
young body are firm and well toned, 
kept in condition by active exercise. 
However, as time goes by, we find 
that there is insufficient time for 
strenuous activity. The muscle loses 
their tone, the natural body girdle 
becomes slack. Tummy starts to 
buldge, thighs and buttocks droop. 
We begin to have weight problems 
and the challenge to get ourselves 
back in shape becomes something 
that we put off until tomorrow.

Passive Exercise may be your 
answer to these problems. A well- 
balanced diet in conjunction with 
passive exercise may be the perfect 
system for you. They can help you 
lose weight and keep it off at

Beautiful Bodies. DeeVee will happy 
to answer your questions and make 
you an appointment.

The Grisham have two children. 
DeeVee and a son Brook who is a

The Miss Donley County Pageant 
will be June 18. 1988 at the
Clarendon College Auditorium at 
7:30 p.m. There are 14 young ladies 
participating in this years pageant 
with the hope to be the next Miss 
Donley County. They are: Audra 
Hoggard-sponsored by the Golden 
Acorn; Bridget Bland-sponsored by 
Judy’s Hair Design; Michelle Cham­
bliss -sponsored by West Texas 
Utilities; Oleta Lane-sponsored by 
Spivey Ranch; Debbie Boren-spons­
ored by J& W Lumber; Michelle 
Farmer-sponsored by The Nook; 
Angel Bramblett-sponsored by 
Hedley Feed Lot; April Bramblett-s 
sponsored by Bailey’ s CanWay; Lani 
Douthit;-sponsored by Harlan ’ s; 
Suzette Henson-sponsored by Hen­
sons; Tammi Hommel-sponsored by 
United Appraisal Co., Inc.; Christina 
White-sponsored by B& R Thriftway 
and Christy Smith-sponsored by 
Mary’s Country Kitchen.

We would like to thank each one of

our business

senior at Garendon - High School. 
Richard is manager of Taylor Food 
Mart. The Grisham family would like 
to extend a special invitation to you 
to attend their open house Saturday.

the contestants for participating in 
this year’s pageant. We would also 
like to thank our Donley County 
businesses for their donations, 
because without their help we would 
be unable to present the 8th Miss 
Donley County Pageant. We hope 
you’ll make an effort to attend this 
year’ s pageant, we know it will be a 
great one!”

Vacation Bible 
School at First 
Baptist Church

The theme for Vacation Bible 
School at First Baptist Church is 
"Living for Jesus” . There will be 
classes for children' 4 years old 
through 6th grade. The school will 
meet from 9:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon 
June 13 to June 17. If you have 
questions or need help with transpor­
tation please call 874-3833. All 
children of the community are invited 
to attend.

14 local girls to compete in 
Miss Donley County Pageant

James T. Carter to retire
Since June 1985, James T. Carter 

has pastored the First United 
Methodist Churches in both Garen­
don and Hedley. On Sunday, June 
12, he will retire, not only from these 
churches, but from 43 years in the 
ministry, as well. Rev. Carter and his 
wife, Juanita, will make their home 
in Lubbock, returning to the place 
where his path to the ministry began.

Born October 23, 1922 in Cooper, 
Texas. Rev. Carter graduated from 
Frenship High School in Wolfforth in 
1939 and Texas Tech in 1947. While 
at Texas Tech, he pastored churches 
in Monroe, Becton and Lakeview. 
From 1947-48, he served as associate 
pastor at Asbury Methodist Church 
in Lubbock, before graduating from 
Perkins School of Theology in 1951.

After graduation. Rev. Carter was 
appointed the first pastor of Forest 
Hill Methodist in Amarillo, later 
moving to Polk Street Methodist 
where he served as associate pastor 
from 1954-56. Between 1956-72, he 
pastored in Panhandle. Lockney, 
Tulia, returning once again to 
Asbury United Methodist in Lub­
bock. From 1975-85, Rev. Carter 
served as associate pastor at Polk 
Street United Methodist before being 
appointed to the Garendon/Hedley 
churches.

Rev. Carter has held and holds 
many poitions within the Northwest 
Texas Conference. During his years 
of active service, he served on 
Boards of Education, Missions, and 
World Peace and was the Conference 
Health and Welfare Commission 
Chairman for six years. He was a 
member of the Wesley Foundation in 
Canyon-both board member and 
chairman for eight years. He held 
numerous other board and commit­
tee responsibilities, including Ele­
mentary Camp Director, District 
Youth Director (several times) and 
District Missionary Secretary.

The memberships of both churches 
have been very pleased and proud to 
have James Carter serve as pastor 
for the past three years. Members 
have been especially impressed with 
Rev. Carter's fine sermons and his 
dedication and sincerity in discharg­
ing his responsibilities as a pastor. 
The quiet and efficient way he goes 
about handling the many assign 
ments that he has in the Conference 
outside of his pastorate is impres­
sive. He and Juanita will be sorely 
missed, although all members wish 
them health and happiness as they 
begin this new journey of their lives. 
Perhaps thev will have more time to

spend with their four grandchildren! 
Rev. Carter says both he and Juanita 
are looking forward to returning to 
Lubbock and becoming a member of 
the Asbury United Methodist 
Church, a place full of wonderful 
memories.

Replacing Rev. Carter will be Rev. 
Terry Tamplen from Snyder. He and 
his wife, Vicki, have two young 
children. As Garendon and Hedley 
bid farewell to the Carters, both 
churches welcome the Tamplen 
family to this area.

Rate increase for GTE
After failure to gain acceptance of 

an offer to withdraw its 1984 rate 
filing and failure to negotiate a 
settlement concerning tax and 
expense issues, GTE Southwest has 
filed updated rate schedules in 
accordance with directives of the 
Public Utility Commission of Texas to 
update the company’ s unresolved 
1984 filing for $84.8 million of 
additional revenues. The financial 
information contained in the updated 
rate filing demonstrates the company 
has an $81 million revenue deficiency 
based on a rate of return which is 
actually lower than the commission’ s 
last authorized rate of return.

GTE Southwest President E.L. 
“ Buddy" Langley said. “ The last 
time the company raised rates was in 
1983. We have known with increased 
expenses and capital investments 
that eventually we would have to ask 
for increased revenues. With the 
downturn in in the Texas economy 
we wanted to delay this as long as 
possible. However, since we are 
being required to update the current 
financials and process the merits of 
the rate filing, we have decided to 
seek the rates necessary to cover the 
revenue deficiency.”

The company filed a petition early 
in 1987 to withdraw its 1984 filing, 
but some participants in the case 
resisted the move, voicing concern 
the company could be overearning 
because of changes in state and 
federal tax laws. As a result, the 
company was ordered to prepare the 
updated information by April 30. An 
extension was granted to allow for 
additional negotiation, but the par­
ties to the case were unable to 
resolve the issues.

Langley said the four-year delay in 
the rate proceeding illustrates the 
complexities caused by deregulation 
and other major changes affecting 
the telecommunications industrv in 
the 1980s.

GTESW initially filed for $M 8 
million in additional revenues in 
February 1984. Prior to hearings, the 
case was suspended to await a

decision in another commission pro­
ceeding concerning changes brought 
about by the AT&T divestiture and 

competition in long-distance service. 
Due to the many complexities associ­
ated with these issues, a final order 
was not issued in this proceeding 
until September 1986.

“ Our updated financials show we 
are not overearning," Langley said. 
“ We have factored in all the changes 
affecting the company, both positive 
and negative, and the result is that 
the company still has an $81 million 
revenue deficiency.

“ The reduced expenses, such as 
the reduction in both state and 
federal taxes, have been more than 
offset by increases in other expenses 
and in our investment in providing 
service in the state." he said.

The company now expects the 
administrative law judge in charge of 
the company's filing will set a 
schedule of dates to allow other 
parties in the case to file appropriate 
testimony and data, and set hearing 
dates to consider the new proposed 
rates.

4-H K-9 KKorp 
sponsors horse shoe

pitching contest

The Donley County 4-H K-9 Korp 
will be sponsoring a HORSE SHOE 
PITCHING CONTEST Saturday. 
June 25th at the Garendon Rodeo 
Arena.

Entries will be $10.00 for a 2 
person team. Cash prizes will be 
awarded. Trophy to the first place 
team

Sign up* will start at noon and 
pitching at 1 p m Come out and join 
in the fun! Get a partner and try 
your luck at pitching for the MONEY 
and TROPHY!



The 9, 19M

graduated from Clarendon High 
School in 1977 and is employed as a 
welder at Broadway Fish Market.

After a wedding trip to Caymun 
Island, the couple will be at home at 
213 Massanet, Port Lavaca.

The rehearsal dinner, hosted by 
the groom’s parents, was held at the 
VFW Hall.

The bride graduated from Calhoun 
High School, Port Lavaca, in 1963 
and is employed as cashier at Ocean 
Inn Restaurant. The bridegroom

Ruddick-Gemer united in marriage

Lee Flower girl was Suzanne Baker, 
' on whose dress was identical to the 
>.m. attendant’s. Ring bearer, Justin 
Port Kartchner, wore a white tuxedo, 
nee- Attending the Bridegroom as his 
ring Best man was his brother, Johnny 

Gerner o f  Grandbury, Texas. 
Mr. Groomsmen were Mark Ruddick and 
Port Douglas Ruddick. brothers o f the 
Dom Bride and Ronnie Kalisek, all o f Port 
W . Lavaca; Ken Shelton, Gary McClel- 

and tan, Eddy Eads and Lynn Floyd all o f 
Clarendon. Ushers were Tim 

rho, Ruddick. brother o f the Bride and 
(an- Gary Ruddick.
w e. Mother o f the Bride wore a pink 
rd’ s dress with an orchid corsage. Mother 
was o f the Groom wore an ice blue tea 

length dress with an orchid corsage.
■ by The reception, followed by a 
i of dinner-dance, was held at the VFW  
cart Hall. The bride’ s table, covered with 
:ves white lace over pink, featured a three 
>ses tiered wedding cake decorated with 
®wn pink roses, and a champagne foun- 
lace tain. On the groom’s table, which 
line was covered with beige lace, was a 
dral German Chocolate cake. Members o f 
«  a the House Party were Ann Stepp, 
end Gloria Karchner, Patty See vers, 
aist Linda Baker, Betty Jemelka, Carolyn 
gift Phillips, Judy Andreas, Sandra 
ond Andreas, Vicky Kalisek, Joan Kali-

Shower for Mary Brown
The table was laid with a white 

lace doth over pink silk, the bride’ s 
colors. Punch, cake, nuts and mints 
were served from crystal appoint­
ments. The centerpiece was a pot o f 
mixed ivy with pink silk flowers.

Two tables displayed the various 
gifts.

Twenty-five friends and family 
called during the evening.

A  miscellaneous bridal shower was 
held for Mary Jaramillo Brown, 
recent bride o f David R. Brown, on 
Friday, June 3,1988 in the Assembly 
o f God Fellowship Hall.

Guests were greeted by the bride, 
her mother, Mrs. Gaudia Jaramillo 
and the groom’s mother, Mrs. J.W. 
Brown. They all wore corsages o f 
pink silk carnations

Putman Reunion
The family o f the late Mr. and Fritsche, Frances Arnold, James 

Mrs. M.L. Putman met at the Auldridge, Trena Alexander, Cleon 
Clarendon Community Center May and Carol Elkins, Gene and Elaine 
28th and 29th for their annual Auldridge all o f Electra; Orville 
reunion. Talley o f Vernon; Kym, Amy and

The oldest one present was Terra M art Bearden o f Plano.
Putman o f Garendon and the youn- Also present were Sheri, Randal

Steelman o f Allen;gest was Tommy Justin Childers o f and Chris __________  ______
Monahans, great grandson o f Jack Charles and Toby Holsenbeck, Hac- 
and Edna Holsenbeck ot Garendon. kett; Larry, Jaquet, Leigh Anne 
The ones coming the fartherest were Frankfather, Ott and Marie Watson 
Charles and Toby Holsenbeck o f all o f Dumas; Paul Hermesmeyer, o f 
Hackett, Art. Others present were Levelland; Gene and Jean Putman o f 
Ad e  Putman o f Panhandle; Dorothy Gaude; Trula and Kim Shults o f 

r i f i M H B H H  Dalhart.
^  Visiting were Karen, Brad and

m  H  JuStin' Kelly' Lvnda' Tim- Jeremy
W %% Tunnell of Childress; Diane,

4‘ James and Michael Pergeson, Billy
▼  j ° e  and Jo Dean McFall, Gary,

Cheryl, Marty. Chad and Anthony 
McFall all of Pampa; Mary and 
Donald Harlan of Tulia; Kim. Devin 
and Chance Waggoner o f Bledsoe;

. Terry, Valorie, Shane. Aaron, and
*  Kasie Ashcraft. Chuck and Wanda

%  Hill all of Hedley; John and Ola Mae

§■ , Morrow Estle
Corranette Goodgoin of Plain view; 
Horace and Elizabeth McDonald of

I  Quitaque; Julie. Mark
Milliam of Altus, Oklahoma.

*  were
Mike, Darren Hunter

H B H H h  Spier, Edna and Jack Holsenbeck, 
Willie and Ola Wil-
liams, Bob and Cula Jo Trout, Bud
and Pearl Hermesmeyer, Guy Put-
man, C. A. and Carmen Wright, Bill 

f l  and Darlene Spier, Bunny and James 
1 Owens, Gyde Putman, Gerald and 

Hazel Noble, Ella Mae Trout, Jr. and 
Wilma Spier. Mr. and Mrs.
Jones. Terra Putman. Joan and Bob 
Kidd, Bobbie, Missy, Keith, Sarah

Cynthia Ann *nd Terra Kidd, Kathy, Danny,
a  Brock and Kala Holland. Lovd and 

Estelle Thomas, Ina Morrow, Miss

he Grandcfalldren o f this handsome, V  McGee> * »d  Norma Putman, 
rang couple want to wish them a K and Ethelyn Grady.

TER RY M OORE AND  SUE CHAMBLESS

Chambless and Moore announce 
engagement
The couple plans to wed on July 8 

at 6:00 p.m. in the First Baptist 
Church o f Hedley. Sue is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Chambless of Garendon and Terry is

the son o f Sharon Ratten of Garen­
don and Joe Moore o f Colorado. All

friends and relatives of the couple 
are invited to attend.

Braddock-Row engagement
Mr. and Mrs. Norman Stewart The couple plan to be married 

would like to announce the upcoming June 11th at 4:00 in the afternoon at 
marriage of their daughter Cassan­
dra Braddock to Ricky Row son of the City Park in Garendon. Friends 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Rowe. and family are invited to attend.

MRS. RICK LEE GERNER

HAPPY
ANNIVERSARY 

June 11th.
New Cars

Motor Co.
1988 GMC PU by A.H. Brorman, 

Vega.
1988 GMC Suburban by L.P. 

Gilven, Amarillo.
1988 Buick by Tom Whitson, 

Amarillo.
1988 GMC Suburban by Stephen 

Friemel, Amarillo.
1988 GMC PU by GUven-TerriU, 

Inc., Amarillo.
1988 GMC PU by Aleta Thompson, 

Garendon.
1988 GMC PU by Jackie R. Blum, 

Memphis.
1988 Pontiac by Dwight E. Crock­

er, Pampa.
1988 Olds by Wiley A. Haydon. 

Canyon.
1988 Olds by Joan O. McAfee, 

Garendon.
1988 GMC Suburban by Norma 

Ward, Pampa.
1988 Olds by Jeanne Brorman, 

Canyon.
1988 Buick by Fred A. King, 

Panhandle.
1988 CadUlac by J.I. Mayes, 

Amarillo.
1988 Buick by W illie Richards, 

Tulia.
1988 Buick by Myrle V. Hunter, 

Pampa.

Flavor a sauce intandad for 
chickan or lamb with spearmint for 
a new taste delight.

KIL0WATTH0URS
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COLOR PHOTOS

WE USE 
KODAK PAPER

Eads Furniture 
and Appliance

□  Set your thermostat on 78° or higher and use ceiling 
or portable fans to help circulate the air.

□  Have your air conditioner serviced annually and 
once a month, check the filter. A  dirtyjilter can 
keep your air conditioner from working efficiently.

□  Keep doors, windows, and drapes firmly closed to keep 
cool air in and heat out.

M i ' ::■
□  Protect celling and walls with adequate insulation.

Make sure cracks around windows, doors, pipes and wiring 
are tightly sealed with caulking and weatherstripping.

□  Use heat producing appliances, like ranges, dishwashers,

The Garendon Press Is published 
every Thursday at 106 S. Kearney 
and entered as Second Gass Mall at 
the post office at Garendon, Texaa. 
J.C. and Helen Woody, publishers 
and editors.

Any erroneous reflection upon the 
character of any person or firm 
appearing In these columns will be 
glsdlv and promptly corrected upon 
being brought to the attention of tb«

Ask about our FREE 
8 x 10 offer

Group Charge 
99* per person 
per 19 wallets

W E S T  T E X A S  U T IL IT IE S  C O M P A N Y

Hie Garendon Press must be picker 
up In 10 days after publishing date.

An f.quAl 
( Jpportunitv 
f mptnyer

A Member o f The C entral and South West System

Remember REDDY supplies the energy 
but only YOU can use it wisely!

TE X A S  PRESS 
ASSOCIATION
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DONLEY COUNTY SENIOR CITIZENS
■ Curing People...A Lam p to  the  C o m m u n ity

Thanks to Rosa Mears Cor the 
cookies Cor Musical Jam on May 
20th. Thanks to Jerry Land for the 
good homemade bread we enjoyed 
last Friday. Thanks to Maude Killian 
Cor the pretty gift items Cor the Arts 
A Crafts shelf. W e truly appreciate 
all o f you.

Had a good crowd at Dance 
Practice last Monday. Several o f the 
dance club members enjoyed the 
Barbee reunion dance at Claude on 
Saturday. June 4th. Thanks to Frank 
and Goldie Barbee for the invite.

Tuesday, May 31, 1988 was our 
M ay B irthday/Anniversary salad 
supper. Despite the bad weather we 
had during the day, forty three came 
out to enjoy the evening o f fellow­
ship. Birthday people present were 
Robert C. Jones, Charlie Norton, 
Dale Hill and Kay Bownds. Didn’t 
have any Anniversary people pre­
sent. Don Wooten got the door prize. 
Fun prizes went to Clara Mae Carter, 
Lucille Jenkins and Jack Davidson. 
As usual lots o f good food to eat.

Friday Night Musical Jams have 
been good. Thanks to the following 
musicians for keeping it going 
strong. The following is a combined 
list o f those playing over the past 
three weeks. Dick Stephens, Weldon 
Petty, Forrest Denton, Jack David­
son, Lucille Swain, Bailey Estes, 
Fred Fortenberry, Maxine Denton, 
Jerry Chambliss, Creed Smith, Jake 
Smith, Dee Williams, Floyd Crof- 
ford. Rose Lee Watson, Johnny and 
Margaret Hancock and Hugh and 
Nova Neuhaus. Listening crowd has 
ranged from twenty-five to about 
thirty-seven.

Got a report that Fun After Fifty 
met on Saturday, June 4, 1988 at the 
Center. About forty enjoyed a day of 
fellowship, lots o f good food and 
were entertained by the Music 
Makers - Forrest Denton, Dee W il­
liams, Creed Smith, Jake Smith and 
Lucille Swain.Sounded like a good 
time day.

June 9-15
Thursday Exercise 11 a.m. Game 
Night 6 p.m.
Friday Exercise 11 a.m. Musical Jam 
Session .7 p.m.
Monday Exercise 11 a.m. Dance 
Practice 7-9 p.m.
T uesday Exercise 11 a.m.. 
Hearing Aid Test A Service 10 
a.m.-12 noon.

Wednesday Exercise 11 a.m., Arts 
and Cratts and Knitting 1 p.m.

Juno 9-15
Pork Roast, Harvard 

beets, English peas, potato salad, 
chocolate pie, dinner roll, milk, tea, 
coffee.

Friday Chicken and dressing, 
giblet gravy, cranberry sauce, yam 
patties, green beans, tossed salad, 
fruit cup, bread, milk, tea, coffee.

M onday Chicken fried steak, bak­
ed potato, buttered carrots, apple 
and celery salad, tapioca pudding 
with raisins, dinner roll, milk, tea, 
coffee.

Tuesday Meat loaf with tomato 
sauce, fried squash, steamed cauli­
flower, pea salad, lemon pie, dinner 
roll, milk, tea, coffee.

W ednesday Bar-B-Q Pork, yam 
patties, baked beans, red jello with 
bananas, egg custard, dinner roll, 
milk, tea, coffee.

City

MIKE’S DESIGNS
Pin Striping, Signs, 
Custom Painting, 
Fiberglass Repair 

MIKE GARRISON 874-2410

Quality Home Remodeling and best of all, it’s

GUARANTEED!
Cathcart Construction Co.

Specialists in:

• Additions
• Kitchens
• Baths
• Custom Homes
• W indow Replacement
• General Remodeling & Repairs

Featuring a planning and decorating service 
and 5 year HOW  insurance on remodeling projects.

Financing Available

Ashtola-M artin news
By Naomi Green

JMinvtes
The Board o f Aldermen of the City 

o f Clarendon met on May 24,1968, in 
the Board Room, City Hall at 7:00 
p.m. Members present were Mayor 
David Davidson, Aldermen James 
Thomas, Paul Bivens, Lynn Floyd, 
Benny Osburn, and Bobbie K. Kidd. 
Others present were City Secretary 
Donna Edwards, Sue Howard, Del­
bert Robertson, Jack Eads, Roger 
Finch and Johnny Jaramillo.

Minutes o f the May 10, 1988 
meeting were read and approved.

Delbert Robertson discussed the 
City HaU/Fire Station roof with the 
Board o f Aldermen. Motion was 
made and carried to advertise for 
bids on replacing the roof.

Motion was made and approved to 
appoint Bobbie K. Kidd as Mayor 
pro-1cm.

The City Board o f Aldermen 
discussed a tentative schedule for 
road repair. The City's plan is to fill 
as many pot holes as possible taking 
care o f die worst ones first and then 
to paving repair by the Post Office 
and at 6th and Kearney, followed by 
some paving on 4th Street and 
Bugbee Street.

Motion was made and approved to 
have the City Secretary write a letter 
to the members o f the Airport Board 
explaining that due to the hours it 
takes to mow the airport, it may 
become necessary to raise hangar 
rent fees.

There being no further City busi­
ness at this time, meeting adjourned.

HOWARDWICK  
Swimming Pool

Now OPEN Daily 
from 1 :0 0  to 7 :0 0  p.m.
(5 years a or under) 5 0 c  
(6 years and older) $1.00
Summer Membership $ 2 5 .0 0 J

Attendant on Duty - No Lifeguard

C A T H C A R T  
Construction Co. M O n  *

4908 Erik • Amarillo. Texas • (8061359-1895 or 355-6837 
Serving the Texas 1‘anhandle for 11 years

STATEMENT OF INTENT 
TO CHANGE RATES

GTE Southwest Incorporated, in 
accordance with the Rules of the 
Public Utility Commission of Texas, 
hereby gives notice of the Company’s 
intent to implement a new schedule 
of rates in Texas, effective July 6, 
1988. This proceeding has been 
previously docketed by the Com­
mission as Docket No. 5610.
The proposed changes in rates will 
affect approximately 970,500 of 
the Company's Texas customers 
who represent all classes of 
customers subscribing to the 
Company's local exchange and 
foreign exchange services within 
the State of Texas, as well as all 
entities subscribing to the Com­
pany's billing and collection 
services within the state. The 
proposed changes in rates are 
designed to increase the Company's 
intrastate revenues by $81,407,000, 
or approximately 11.8 percent 
annually.
Persons who wish to intervene or 
otherwise participate in these 
proceedings should notify the 
Commission as soon as possible. A 
request to intervene, participate, or 
for further information should be 
mailed to the Public Utility Com­
mission of Texas, 7800 Shoal Creek 
Boulevard, Suite 400N, Austin, 
Texas 78757. Further information 
may also be obtained by calling the 
Public Utility Commission -Con­
sumer Affairs Division at (512) 
458 0223, (512) 458-0227, or 
(512) 458 0221 teletypewriter for 
the deaf.
A complete set of revised rate 
schedules has been filed with the 
Public Utility Commission at Austin, 
Texas, and is available for public 
inspection in each of the Com­
pany’s Business Offices in the State 
of Texas. A summary of the 
Company's rate filing has also been 
sent to the Mayor’s office of each 
affected Municipality.

GTE Southwest 
Incorporated

M ARK BAIN

Mark Bain selected 
as Outstanding college 
student of America

Pud Bain has been notified that his 
grandson, Mark Bain, has been 
selected as an Outstanding College 
Student o f America and Mark will be 
listed in the 1988 OCSA directory.

This directory will be distributed to 
American colleges, universities and 
corporations for their use in student 
admissions, internships, and 
employment. Mark also will be 
eligible to compete for several scho­
larships. Mark is a senior student at 
Texas A  A M  University. He is the son 
o f Mr. and Mrs. Jim Bain o f Tracy, 
California.

Fitzgerald fam ily 
reunion
Family members o f the late D.M. 

and D ollie F itzgera ld  gathered 
recently for a weekend reunion at the 
home o f Pete and Eunice Land. 
Besides five o f the Fitzgerald chil­
dren who attended, there were 
members o f the fourth generation 
present.

Enjoying the weekend were: Mr. 
and Mrs. W .H. Fitzgerald o f Silver- 
ton, Mrs. Letha Mulder o f Floydada, 
Mrs. Inez Minyard o f Littlefield and 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale McGaugh of 
Clarendon.

Others visiting at various times 
were: Lisa and Phil Fitzgerald o f 
Collinsville; Guinn Fitzgerald and 
DeLynn, Lee Ann and Shirley Dur­
ham of Silverton; Jerry, Kathy and 
Rhonda Taylor, Jeff, Tara, and 
Amber House, Linda Wehrbein and 
Bob Spagler, Shirley Bulman o f 
Canyon; Gary ana and Candy Gilley 
o f Amarillo) Nathan and Kathy 
Mulder o f Floydada; Anthony Wood, 
Bill and Helen Land.

Glenda and Richard Patterson had 
all o f their children home for Memor­
ial Day weekend. Ronald, Joy Nell, 
Melissa and Christy Howard came 
from Borger, Cindy, Danny, Michael 
and Chris Seamore came from Fritch, 
and Richard Jr. Patterson came from 
Kansas.

Vance and Ismanell Gray went 
with Buster Gray Tuesday to Floyda­
da for the graduation o f Jason 
Brown. Jeannene, Dusty and David 
Tittle and Jerry and Gloria Grav. 
Cam and Amy all o f Canyon met 
them there. Larry Gray o f Earth, 
Joyce Jackson o f Lubbock and her 
daughter Yvonne Gipson and Aman­
da o f Levelland also attended the 
graduation. Charline and Butch 
Brown hosted a supper afterwards at 
their home in Floydada.

Melba Risley spent last weekend 
in Lubbock with the Thornberry 
family. Even though school was out 
things had not slowed down as Trish 
was in a ball tournament and Melba 
attended Seth’s game. Trish was 
excitedly getting ready for a social 
studies tour o f the caves at Sonora 
and on to San Antonio. She had 
earned part o f the money for her trip 
babysitting.

Lloyd, Virgil, Marie and Tressa 
Risley o f Amarillo were guests 
during the Memorial Day weekend in 
the Lloyd Risley home.

Thursday the Lacy Nobles and the 
Emmett Simmons played dominoes 
with the Lloyd Risleys at their home.

Jerry Green was among the Cub 
Scouts to attend the Area Day Camp 
at M K Brown Camp. Mary Green 
took some o f the boys each day. The 
fathers came Friday for overnight 
camp for the Webloes.

Naomi Green attended the Band 
Concert for Austin Jr. High last 
Thursday night. Charlotte Payne was 
awarded the Most Valuable Wood 
Wind Award.

Gaude and Eadith Spivey have 
returned from their trip to Temple for 
Medical checkups. They got a good 
report.

Gaude and Eadith Spivey went to 
Altus, Okla. for a reunion o f Gaude’s 
sister-in-laws family. All o f Verda 
Walker’s children, grandchildren 
and other relatives and friends 
gathered to celebrate her 80th birth­
day.

C. I. Casteel o f Country Gub 
Manor, Amarillo and Elizabeth 
Smith o f Amarillo visited with Rose

Lee Watson Wednesday.
Bud and Betty White had supper 

Saturday night with the L.A. Wat­
sons.

Sunday of Memorial Day weekend 
the Martin Baptist Church had an old 
fashion singing from 4:00 to when­
ever. Sixty-five to seventy attended.

Robin and Pauline Green o f Lub­
bock had supper with the H.A. 
Green’s Monday week and visited 
with the Jerry Green family.

Mae and Duane Naylor visited 
with the H.A. Greens enroute to 
Amarillo to visit with the Richard 
Naylor family. They visited with 
Thelma Hall at the Nursing Home in 
Memphis and Royce was down for a 
visit so they got to see him there too. 
Duane said crops were up in Foard 
County but they were still plenty 
scared of wind. They returned home 
last evening Thursday after a visit 
with Royce in his home and had a 
shower that day.

Jerry is planting no till cotton. We 
have gotten over everything dry 
enough since that frog hollaring inch 
and quarter rain Memorial Day 
weekend.

School’s out

School’s out and there’ s no cares 
or worries for tomorrow’s lessons. 
Many children get excited while 
playing and forget the rules o f life.

Major V. J. Cawthon, Regional 
Commander o f the Department o f 
Public Safety is calling on all Texas 
motorist to drive with extra care this 
time o f year. He said, "Long tiring 
trips across the West Texas Plains 
can be nerve racking on all occupants 
in the car. Frequent rest periods 
should be used so the children can 
run off that excessive pent-up 
energy.”  The Major also reminds us 
to be extra careful to keep alert while 
driving in residential areas.

Children seem to forget safety 
rules and run into the roadways 
unexpectedly, not realizing that the 
oncoming car is in the local vicinity. 
Since the younger children do not 
know the law, it would be wise to 
always expect the unexpected and be 
prepared to give him the right-of- 
way.

Major Cawthon said, "That in 
order to make this an accident free 
summer vacation, we need to take a 
more mature attitude towards safe 
driving. Let us all remem it to slow 
down a little and live slot by driving 
defensively each and every day this 
summer while school is ou t!"

Young
Homemakers

The Young Homemakers 
Extension Gub would like to thank 
the following people for helping 
make our 1st annual Spring Tasting 
Luncheon a big success.
All the Gub members who prepar - 

ed food, the public who purchased 
tickets, The Grocery Store and B A R  
Thriftway for all their donations, the 
First Christian Church for the use of 
their Fellowship Hall, the State 
Highway Dept, for the ice and the 
Nazarene Church for the use o f their 
copier to copy our cookbook.

SWIMMING LESSO N S
will be available starting June 6 at Clarendon Country Club. 
Gaooes will be Monday, Wednesday and Friday afternoon at

1:00 • 2:00 p.m. for 9 yean  and older 
2:30 -3:30 p.m. for 6-8 yr olds 
4:00-5:00 p.m. for 3-5 yr oMa

The fee will be $25.00 for 8 leooons.

LADIES W ATER EXERCISE CLASSES 
Thursday and Friday mornings 

10:30-11:30 a. m.

To enroll contact either the

C L A R I N D O N  C O U N T R Y  C L U B
874-2863

or Shannon Norris, Certified Water Safety Instructor, 874-2764

UNCLE SAM 
WANTSYOU 
TO TAKE
ADVANTAGE 
OF HIM!

i f  Reduce your federal income tax. This
could amount to several 

hundred dollars!
★  Continue reductions in future years if 

you so choose!

i t  Save for your retirement and pay no 
taxes on your earned interest until 
you retire!

See our IRA Specialist for complete details.

OPEN ANIRA Account
Today !

O F  C L A R E N D O N
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FEAR NOT 

By JON LEGG1TT
The consistent message ot tne 

Lord in both Old and New Test­
aments to his troubled people is: 
“ Fear not. 1 am with thee.” ,

Let's take a brief look at some o f 
the trying situations Biblical char­
acters found themselves in when 
God's loving, calming voice came, 
and. flooding them with His peace 
that passes all understanding, said, 
"F ea r N o t!"

In Genesis 15:1, the Bible says, 
“ After these things the word o f the 
Lord came unto Abram in a vision, 
saying. Fear not. Abram: I am thy 
shield, and thy exceeding great 
reward.”  "These things" could refer 
to several difficult situations: the call 
o f Abram at age seventy-five to leave 
his homeland for an unknown des­
tination (Genesis 12:1). famine and

otber.troubles in Egypt, or the rescue 
o f his nephew Lot from invading 
kings. And what o f the vision itself? 
Would not that be terrifying to 
almost anyone? Abram -• later to 
become Abraham -  had found 
himself in many frightening posi­
tions, but the Lord says to him. 
“ Fear not."

Ten o f the twelve sent out by 
Moses to spy out the land o f Canaan 
(Numbers 13:17) brought back a 
fearful report o f Anak, which come o f 
the giants: and we were in our own 
sight as grasshoppers, and so we 
were in their sight" (Numbers 
13:33). But the Lord, through the 
mouths o f Joshua and Caleb, said, 
"...their defense is departed from 
them, and the Lord is with us: fear 
them not" (Numbers 14:9).

After the terrible greed and dis- 
bedience o f Achan which brought 
defeat for the Israelites, and dread­
ful, heart-sickening punishment to 
Achan’ s house, ‘ ...the Lord said unto 
Joshua. Fear not, neither be thou 
dismayed. . . "  (Joshua 9;1).

Joshua 10:25: "and Joshua said 
unto them. Fear not, nor be dis­
mayed. be strong and of good 
courage, for thus shall the Lord do to

The

all your enemies against whom ye 
figh t." This word came after the 
awesome display o f the Lord’ s power 
in making the sun and moon stand 
still, and after yet another bloody 
bout between the war-sick Israelites 
and their enemies.

The psalmist, who had been 
through about as much difficulty as 
any man could imagine, could still 
say. in Psalm 118:6, "The Lord is on 
my side; 1 will not fear: what can man 
do unto me?” .

In Mark 6, Jairus, a ruler o f the 
synagogue, came to Jesus requesting 
healing for his daughter. As they 
were on their way to bedisde, a 
servant met Jairus with the news that 
the girl had died. "B e  not afraid, 
only believe," said Jesus, and in 
verses 41 and 42, the daughter was 
brought to life again.

From these few examples, we see 
God’s people in some of life's most 
traumatic circumstances: war, fa­
mine. trembling at the awesome 
display of God’ s supernatural power, 
outnumbred and outclasses militarily 
by giants, uprooted from familiar 
surroundings, heartsick from the re­
sults o f sin, in the depths o f sorrow at 
the passing of a loved one. Yet,

BEAUTIFUL BODIES
INVITES YOU TO

O P E N  H O U S E
10 a.m. - 5 p.m. Friday, June 10th

Refreshments and Free Demo Session 

Located Above Bivens Pharmacy

Need to Invest?

SPECIAL
SUMMERTIME 

CD OFFER.
If your current investments are maturing this 

summer, you need to make plans now as to 
where you want to invest. Montfort Savings has 
the answer. . .Our “Smart and Simple” 
Certificates of Deposit are perfect instruments for 
investors who are faced with the dilemma of 
where to invest their money.

90 Day CD/1 Y r. Rate
This answer lets you invest for as little as 90 
days, but still receive our attractive 1 year 
interest rate, 7.40%.

The Add-O n CD _
This unique product is the answer for flexibility. 
You can add funds to your new certificate up to 
3 times during the 1 year term at 7.40%.

» *

The reservation deadline 
for these certificates 
is June 30, 1988.
But you may have 
until August 31,
1988, to make 
your initial 
deposit.

You will be under no 
obligation and have 

nothing to lose by 
reserving the 

opportunity to 
invest in these 

limited-time 
instruments.

S A V I N G S
A S S O C I A T I O N ,  F S A

M em ber FSLIC

A s  Smart A s  It Is Simple.
1 19 South 6th Street Memphis, Texas 7 9 2 4 5  (806 ) 2 5 9 -5 5 7 7

Deposits of S500 to S25.000 Rates subiect to change Penalty for early withdrawal.

9, 1988

Do the circumstances o f your life 
have you cowering in fear, not 
knowing what will happen, or where 
to turn? Have daily cares, like 
financial matters, caused you to 
become disheartened? Does it seem 
that the Lord is not aware o f your 
situation, or that He does not care? 
Do you have a giant o f a problem in 
Your life? Listen as He speaks to 
those concerned about both the big 
things and the little things o f life in 
the twelfth chapter o f Luke: "...your 
Father knoweth that ye have need o f 
these things..." (verse 30. "...Seek 
ye the kingdom o f God; and all these 
things shall be added unto you" 
(verse 31). And what better summary 
o f what God wants for you could be 
found than in verse 32: "Fear not, 
little flock: for it is your Father’ s 
good pleasure to give you the 
kingdom."

MS IMPI 8 8

JOHN W H U A M  STEPHENS
John William Stephens, 72, died 

Sunday. Services will be at 2:00 p.m. 
on Wednesday at the First Baptist 
Church in Hedley with Rev. Bryan 
Knowles, Pastor, officiating. Burial 
will be in Rowe Cemetery by Spicer 
Funeral Home o f Memphis.

Mr. Stephens was born in Royston 
and was a member o f the Baptist 
Church. He had lived in Hedley since 
1951. He married Inez Skaggs in 
1938 in Memphis. ________________

Survivors include his wife: Inez; 
two sons, Johnny Lee Stephens of 
Sparta, Tennessee and Bobby Glenn 
Stephens o f Amarillo; one daughter, 
Carolyn Mann o f Pam pa; two bro­
thers, Wilson Stepens of Hedley and 
O.D. Stephens o f Roswell, N .M .; one 
half brother J.T. Stephens o f Snyder; 
2 sisters, Donnie Selby o f Hedley and 
Jo Winegeart o f McLean; three half 
sisters, Josie Ziegenfuss o f Saugus, 
Ca., Dorothy Nelson o f  Rio Alton, Ca 
and Ruth Teague o f Houston; nine 
grandchildren, Douglas, Terry , 
Michael and Mitchell Stephens o f 
Sparka, Tennessee, Kimberly Hol­
land, Gaye McGuire and Connie 
Stephens of Amarillo, Carla Stout 
and Charla Mann o f Pampa; five 
great grandchildren, Nathalie Hol­
land Christopher Holland, Kyle 
McGuire, Bradley McGuire o f 
Amarillo and Ashlie Stout o f Pampa.

Pallbearers are: Leon Ward, John 
Hall, Virgil McPherson. Mike Wal- 
lendorff, Terry Bailey, and Nookie 
Wiggins.

Honorary pallbearers are: Otis 
Holland, Junior Hill, O’Neil Wea­
therly, Buford Holland, Edgel Tis­
dale and Tige Hill.

ANDREW DAVID BROWN

Funeral services for Andrew 
David Brown, age 43, were held at 
2:00 p.m. on Tuesday, June 7, 1988 
in Faith Baptist Church in Amarillo 
with Rev. Ron McMullan, Former 
Pastor o f Colorado and Rev. Richard

ORDERA 
BANANA SPLIT. 

GETA 
BUNCH OFF.

t *9 9Fresh, delicious bananas. Your favorite fruit toppings: strawberry, pineapple, and chocolate. And plenty of whipped topping, too! No one makes ’em like DQ-and they’re on sale now!
™ k <3 > C0UNTRY

•Ra9TMAm.aa.Cap. c W01*. DO.OpCaun -AI pomcipUnfl Dolry Quooo Morw

M f l A D f J t f O  T V S T  A M D  I l i V I C I
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H # i i ill l l o k

June 14, 1988
COM M IT COUATMOUM  
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R tg itU rtd
Nursts

The Department of Nursing At 
Coronado Hospital

o i m w a m

Inu iL* y eu 

U 1+ jvati +1 tk*

S i/ r r iQ s  W o d w / r ic le / r b ,

!pT6<yKVm

PR|)dE TIME NURSING 
7 am. lo 7 pm - •17/hr 
7 pm. to 7 om. - •19/hr 
7 am. to 11 pm. • •18/hr

C « M |U  Hm # iUI k u  u i i I U  •  IM M W IIM

M<ki|« d.si|n.d l «  r.fist.f.d lin n  wk. i q
•M  k m  I  NMd 1.1  l.tNIMCt k«M llt! l i t
• • • I d  tik. I* m in iu m  lk .ii c itk  c m m u m I i m . 
Tkn p 1* 1 11 1 . i , iM ilib k  in IN t *k« i n  itn lik lt  
U .w k  •• tki a n k M d  on any amt.

Coll Director of Nursing • 806 /665-3721
Mondial - Pampa, Tnan

Neyem, Pastor o f St. Mary’s Catholic 
Church in Groom, officiating. Inter­
ment was at 3:45 p.m. in Jericho 
Cemetery in Jericho with arrange­
ments under the direction o f Robert­
son Funeral Directors.

Mr. Brown died at 2:07 p.m. on 
Sunday, June 5, 1988 in High Plains 
Baptist Hospital in Amarillo follow­
ing a short illness. He was born July 
1, 1944 in Amarillo and had been a 
lifelong resident o f Jericho. He 
married Betty Rae Britten on Febru­
ary 20, 1971 at Groom. He was a 
fanner and rancher and a member o f 
Faith Baptist Church in Amarillo.

Survivors include his wife, Betty 
Rae Brown of Jericho; one daughter, 
Heather Brown o f Jericho; one son, 
Kevin Brown o f Jericho; his mother 
and step-father, Melba and Johnny 
Leathers o f Clarendon; and one 
sister, Linda Luttrell o f Amarillo.

Casket bearers were Chester W il­
liams, Swanson Haggerman, Bill 
Homer, Tom Wagner, Earl Shields, 
and Mike Watson.

Honorary bearers were Chris Brit­
ten, Stanley Lamb, Johnny Bill 
Hermesmeyer, Phillip Hermesmey- 
er, Lloyd Littlefield, Gordon Schaffer 
and Rex Brown.

The family requests that memori­
als be to the Groom Ambulance 
Service, Groom, Texas 79039.

Johnson
reunion

CLAR K ! HEARING 
AID  SERVICE

All enjoyed lunch at the Memphis 
Park and visited at the Johnson 
reunion. Those attending were Katr­
ina and Brandi Osburn o f Amarillo; 
Alfred Johnson, Wilms and Manford 
Snelson, Blackie and Shirley John­
son, Kendra and Matt Martin, 
Walter Johnson, S. J. Johnson, Kevin 
Johnson, S.J. Johnson, Jr., Woodroe 
and Ora Pearl Farris all from Hedley; 
Jewel and Ozell Mays, Minnie 
Baliask, Lavis Johnson, Joe, Pakey, 
and Kale Brandon, Billy, Jackie and 
Lacey Pierce, Monica Pierce, Christi 
Monquecho, Brendon Fangman, 
K. J. and Wilma Johnson, Tommy 
Johnson, and Cecil Johnson all from 
Amarillo.

Also attending were: Lillie Mae 
and Metford Dennis, MaysviUe, Ok., 
Loyd and Theolo Leeper, Steve, Nita, 
Chad and Keena Ellis o f Clarendon; 
Marsha Favor o f Childress, Arthell 
and Velva Gibson, Derrick Degen of 
Pampa; G yde and Lucille Johnson o f 
Fort Worth; Grady and Charlene 
Milton, Eunice Johnson, o f White 
Deer; Charles, Carrie, Lade and 
Logan Milton of Fritch; Dovie L. Ivy, 
o f Lindsey, Okla., Pearlie, Bob and 
Wade Wyrick, Dumas; Andy and 
Mamie Andrews, Natalie and Lori 
Doyle Johnson, Florida; Edie John­
son, DeAnn, David, Ed Martin and 
Melissa, Trisha Johnson, Bud, Ann 
and Cindy Johnson, Sandra, Greg 
and Kelly Wilkason all o f Amarillo; 
and Lenora Christians, Lindsay, 
Okla.; and Aldred and Phyllis Day o f 
Elk City, Okla.

t h e
Q o lO e n
A c o p n

NEW  SUMMER SCHEDULE 
AND PRICES

Thursday, Jane 9tii 
Mexican Food or Salad Plato

Friday, June 10th 
New York Pork Chops or 

Staffed Potato

Saturday, June 11th 
Mexican Food

Sunday, June 12th 
Traditional Sunday Dinner 
Family Style Plato Lunch

Closed Monday, June 13th

Tneaday, June 14th 
Family Day-Lunch

Steak Night

Wednesday, Jane 15th 
Chicken Fried Steak *  Fried Chicken

Thursday, Jane 16th 
Chlneee Food or Salad Plato

Friday, June 17th 
Quiche or Salad Plato

Saturday, Jane 18th 
Seafood

Lench-11(45-7*00 p.m. 
Dtnner-6t30-8i00 p.m. 

For Evening meek Reservation 
Appreciated but walk-las 

■ro welcome.
Week Day Plate I 
$4,501 
syl

(
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H edley
BY NINA RIDDLESPURGER

sympathy 
extire Si 

On W.

Stone had a visit on Wed- 
from Jack and Joyce Moores 

i Houston.
Naylor spent Thursday in 

visiting with her mother, 
i Owens.

4Saturday Mr.and Mrs. Ervin 
from Lockney visited with 

lesser and Kate Stone.
Oi Sunday Kates great great 

grat son and his girl friend came 
fron Amarillo to visit with her. He is 
Rob e Carr.

H rold and Mary Ruth had some of 
the children home over the week­
end They are Shanna, Danny, 
Do ■ and Dustin Monroe from 
AH i. Also joining them were 
Ret e , Gary, Carrie, Heather and 
L$i on Shields o f Leila Lake.

(  i Friday night a wedding shower 
wa held at the Lioness Hall for 
Lai oss Springer.

' le tables were decorated in red 
an gray. LaMoss received many 
be itiful and useful gifs. Hostess for 
th event were her fellow teachers 
an friends There were 31 hos- 
te tes.

ong time resident John Stephens 
at his home on Sunday 

5 th. Our deepest 
his wife, Inez and the 

family.
y Opal and Tom 

had a visit from their son 
from Amarillo. They are 
arolyn and Benjamin

their other two children 
the weekend. They are 

Paula Gendennon. Tony is 
view and Pula is from 

On Sunday they went to 
Lake and had a cook out. 
had lots o f fun and good

June 3rd was Alfred 
s birthday, 
birthday Alfred!

Howell celebrated her birth- 
Saturday June 4th. Hope 

had a great day. 
y , June 5th was John Wad- 

iy. Happy Birthday John! 
Kaufman has been in 

this last week. She went to her 
iters graduation. She is 

Knightstep. She is the daugh- 
John Ray and Cathy Knight­

ly Harris just returned from 
visit. Dorothy spent several 

at Lake Kemp with 3 o f her 
. Her children who was at the 

with her were her daughter and 
from Hedley. They are 

and Gw an Wilkinson. Also 
her was two o f her sons and 
. They are David and Daniel 

bury and families.
Murry had a visit from her 

ddghter Friday and Saturday. She is 
P Day from Lubbock.

ihorty Crawford had a neice who 
s :nt the night with her on Monday 
i [ht. She is Linda Edwards from 
] yor, Okla.
Doyle and Evelyn Messer had a 
sit from their daughter and grand 
lildren over the weekend. They are 
ngelia Hines and Children from 
.narillo.
4ora Hartwell had a visit from her 

ioi and daughter-in-law from Amar- 
11* on Sunday. They are Nonnie and 
Jgses Hartwell.

im and Jean Taylor had a visit 
iy from Jean’s niece and her 

band. They are Jan and Jean 
from Groom.

[gel and Audra Tisdale went to 
on Friday to visit Audea’ s 

fephew who is in the hospital. He 
kd by pass surgery at St. Anthony’ s

Hedley Baseball
Now that school is out Hedley has 

I lot o f ball teams playing in and
____ 3 Hedley.
The T  Ball team with Coach Bryan 

has the following members: 
_  - Wade, Karli Hill, Ashley Hill. 

J i t t  Talley. Jeremy Gatlin, LaRae 
Shaw, Crystal Solis, Holly Moore, 
Nichole Johnson, Rhett Holland, 
Lynn Holland, Melissa Gibbons and 
Sam Russell. They have already 
played several games. They will have 
a gmm+ at Garendon on Saturday the 
Uth at 9:00 a.m. and also a game on 
Saturday te 18th at Hedley. Lets all 
go out and support these kids. They 
are all doing a great job.

The Little League Team has 
Raymond Woodard for their Coach. 
The members o f this team are: 
Rachel Woodard, Frank Ramirez. 
Daphina Hare, Angie Longan, Rob­
bie Longan. Lynn Secrest, Joe 
Beachy. Isubel Rameriz. Tiffany 
Wilkinson and Noah Solis.

The Minor League Team Coaches 
are James Edward Potts and Bill 
Hill. The members of this team are: 
James Lee Potto, Matt Hill, Josh 
Talley. James Turner, T.J. Turner, 
Sammy Stover, Jeremy Monroe. 
Melody Gibbons. Jana Hill, Cindy 
Lee. Christina Woodard, Chris Solis, 
Roy Rameriz. David Ward. Jason 
Gilbert. They will have a game on 
Tuesday at 6 p.m.

Hospital. He to Windall Comby.
BUI and Veda WaddeU went to 

McLean on Thursday to visit with 
Veda’ s Brother-in-law who is in the 
nursing home there. He is Pat 
Myers.

They also visited with Veda’ s 
nephew and neice whUe in McLean. 
They are Adrian and Lois Myers.

On Friday Roy and Dorothy Harris 
went to Lubbock to attend the com­
mencement for M onterey H igh 
School at the Lubbuck Municipal 
Coliseum.

Their grandson Bryan Douglas 
Harris was valdktorian. His grade 
point average was 4.69. Bryan is the 
son o f Mr. and Mrs. Tanny Harris o f 
Lubbock. He is also the great great 
grandson o f the late will Barker o f 
Garendon.

NeU Land had a visit on Monday 
from Mildred and Johnny Pugh from 
Amarillo. They all had lunch at the 
Hedley Sr. Citizens and Monday 
afternoon they went to WeUington.

THESE YOUNG MEN

Hedley
Senior

Citizens
NINA RIDDLESPURGER

W e had some special guests for 
our musical on Monday night. There 
were three young men who sang and 
played gospel music for us. They 
were really great singers and musici­
ans and everyone really enjoyed their 
music.

There were 52 people who attend­
ed. Those who supplied our music 
were Johnny Woodard, Don Taylor 
and Tommy Henson.

W e had 4 tables playing 84 on 
Tuesday night.

There were 6 who came from the 
Memphis Conv. Center to have lunch 
with us on Wednesday. They were 
Mitchell Pritchard, Elmo Kennedy, 
Oma Crisler, Berta Hayes, Lois 
Perdval and Mabel Owens. W e 
really enjoyed having these folks for 
lunch.

W e had 6 who went on our grocery 
shopping trip on Wednesday after­
noon. Thanks to Dean Hill for this.

There were 3 tables playing 84 on 
Thursday night.

Our June 24th trip to Texas and 
picnic is full. W e still have a few 
places left on the July 8th trip. Be 
sure to get your name down if  you 
want to go before the list is full.

Calendar o f Events 
June 9-15

Ifrumday Bridge Gub 2 p.m.. M  
G lib  7 p.m., Blood Pressure Ginic 
12:30-1:30 p.m.

for the

Friday Exercise Class 10:30-11:00 
a.m., Friday night out to eat S:30 
p.m.

Monday Exercise Gass 10:30- 
11:00 a.m.. Musical 7 p.m.

Tuesday 84 Gub 7 p.m.
Wodnaadpy Grocery Trip 2:30 

p.m. Call Center by 2:00 p.m. i f  you 
need to go. You will be picked up at 
your home between 2:00 and 2:30 
p.m. Exercise Class 10:30-11:00 a.m.

Menu 
June 9-15

Thursday Fish with tarter sauce, 
hash brown potatoes, butter beans, 
pickled beets-onion slice, corn muffin 
oleo, cant elope, milk, tea, coffee, 

juice.
Friday Roast beef, buttered spin­

ach, macaroni and cheese, waldorf 
salad, roll-oleo. peach cobbler, milk, 
tea, coffee, juice.

Monday Catfish with tarter sauce, 
potato salad, navy beans, cabbage 
slaw, corn m uffin-oleo, purple 
plums, milk, tea, coffee, juice.

T uesday Steak with gravy, mashed 
potatoes, blackeyed peas, jellied fruit 
salad, roll-oleo, cherry cobbler, milk, 
tea, coffee, juice.

W ednesday M eat sauce with 
spaghetti, fried okra, steamed cauli­
flower, green veg. salad, roll-oleo, 
tapioca pudding, milk, tea, coffee, 
juice.

Hedley 
Lion’s Club

The Hedley Lions’ Gub held 
officer induction ceremonies on 
Thursday, June 2. New officers are 
as follows: President Bill Carson. 
Secretary/Treasurer Paul Ferguson, 
1st V.P. Murrell Whitaker, 2nd V.P. 
Travis Bland, 3rd V.P. Doyle Mess­
er. Lynn Cherry hosted the induction 
ceremonies.

Glyndol Holland, retiring presi­
dent, presented information on 
Lion’s Club accomplishments during

. Wes Ashcraft 
Mason Shoe Dealer

Come by 
609 Burkhead

* or Call 874-3143

M  i  k <e's_ 
P h 'a fm a c

Senior
Citizens
Receive

15%
Discount On 
Prescriptions

Mall
Orders
receive
Prompt
Service

Welcome

PCS
Member 

Pharmaceutical 
Card System, 

Inc.

Across From 
[B A R T H R IF T W A Y

874-3554

'Four Medicines for Glaucoma
Glaucoma, a condition of increased pressure 

from fluid build-up within the eye, is the leading 
cause of blindness in the United States. Eye 
specialists commonly use one or more medicine 
groups to treat this condition. Each group has 
its own specific advantages and disadvantages.

Beta Blockers: These medicines reduce eye 
pressure by slowing the production of aqueous 
fluid within the eye. Timolol was the first of 
the beta blockers used in glaucoma.

Adrenalin-Like Agents: Epinephrine and 
related compounds are thought to ease eye 
pressure by improving eye fluid drainage.

Cholinesterase Inhibitors: Phyaostigmine, 
demecarium bromide, and echothiopate iodide 
cause drainage of aqueous fluid from within the 
eye for prolonged periods of time (several days 
for some of these drugs).

D irect-Acting Miotics: Pilocarpine and 
related medications reduce eye pressure by 
causing certain eye muscles to contract, w h i c h  

open the canal that drains fluid from the eve

Dsn Taytor,

the fiscal year. The following infor­
mation is from that report:

The Hedley Lions’ Gub began an 
active year of community service in 
July. Members held s goal setting 
meeting and outlined community 
service projects as the number one 
goal for the year.

Five major fund raising projects 
were held this year. The Cotton 
Festival was the major project. 
Others included two trap shoots, a 
broom sale, and a pancake supper. 
Proceeds .rotn all o f these events 
were directed back to community 
projects.

Ten direct community projects 
were supported by Hedley Lions 
during 1987-88. The Gub sponsored 
a barbeque-pit canopy construction 
project in August, a community 
barbeque in September, and the 
Cotton Festival in October. The Gub 
spent over five thousand dollars on 
these three projects with most o f that 
money either directly or indirectly 
benefiting the Hedley community. 
The Gub also donated the following 
money to local improvement pro­
jects: S400.00 to the Lioness street 
sign project, 550.00 to the Hedley 
yearbook, $150.00 to the Hedley Fire 
Department, 5400.00 to Rowe Ceme­
tery for construction of a metal 
archway entrance, 525.00 to a War 
on Drugs project for Hedley School, 
and 5200.00 to the Hedley EMT 
Fund. Tiffany Wilkinson was also 
supported in her efforts to be Miss 
Pre-Teen America with a 550.00 
donation. In all, approximately 
56.200.00 was returned to the com­
munity through these projects.

Mr. Holland also reported that the 
maintenance o f the Lions’ Den serves 
as a valuable asset to the community. 
The Den provides a meeting place for

MIKE WANTS TO BE 

YOUR PHARMACIST

various community groups, funeral 
meals, family reunions, etc. The 
Lions’ Gub spent approximately 
$2,750.00 to maintain and upgrade 
the Lions’ Den during this fiscal 
year. Donations for Den use brought 
in only 5375.00.

The Gub also participated at the 
state and international level. A  
donation o f 5125.00 was given to the 
Girl’s Town Coat and Shoe Fund. 
The Crippled Children’s Camp was 
given 5300.00 and 5100.00 was given 
to help elect Mike Butler as Lions’ 
International third vice president. 
Over 51100.00 was paid for state and 
international dues. Two representa­
tives from Hedley will also represent 
Texas and Hedley at the Lions’ 
International Conference in Denver, 
Colorado. 5300.00 will be paid by the 
Gub to help defray the expenses of 
each member,

Mr. Holland also recognized the 
passing o f several present and 
former Lions. Frank Murray, Bill 
Bridges, Hobart Moffitt, and Ross 
Springer were recognized for their 
past efforts in Gub work. People 
much as these will certainly be 
missed. New members are certainly 
needed. I f  you would like to "serve” , 
contact a Lion. It can certainly be a 
rewarding experience.

Perfect attendance pins were given 
to Pauline Kaufman, Helen Lamber 
son, Betty Williams, Jane Long, 
Evelyn Messer, Betty Morgan, Mary 
Ruth White, Jesse Roland. Louise 
Stewart and Sue Weatherly.

Hedley Lioness 
Club

The Lioness Gub met on Thursday 
night, June 2nd with the lions Gub 
for a combined installation o f officer 
and a pot luck supper.

There were 15 Lioness Gub mem­
bers present and 1 guest, Dorothy 
Brinson.

A repot o f club activities was given 
by Helen Lamberson.

Special guests were Lynn and 
Ginny Cherry. Lynn installed the new 
officers.

The new officers are: President 
Evelyn Messer, 1st Vice. Pres Doro­
thy Whitaker, 2nd Vice Pres. Nora 
Hopper, 3rd Vice. Pres. Sharon 
Ferguson, sec. Juanell Carson, 
Tress. Jesse Roland, Board o f Direc 
tors-Pauline Kaufman, Jane Long, 
Nancy Woodard and Faye Patton.

A gift was presented to Helen 
Lamberson by club members and 
Lynn Cherry also presented her with 
a gift.

Helen also gave a gift to each of 
her officers.

Lynn Cherry was given a money 
clip with his initials from the 
members of the Lions and Lioness 
Gubs.

Skaggs

reunion

The family o f John A Hattie 
Skaggs bad their annual reunion 
Saturday June 4th at the Lions Den. 
Everyone enjoyed s delicious meal. 
Later on in the afternoon some 
played games and enjoyed music 
played by Johnny Woodard, Carolyn 
Mann and Louise Skaggs.

Out o f town guest were Mr. and 
Mrs. Harvey Skaggs o f Ojai, Calif.; 
Mrs. Harry Skaggs o f Amarillo, Mrs. 
Jim Anna Holland o f Clarendon, Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny' Woodard and 
Amanda o f Lefors, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ricky Skaggs, Jason and Jared o f 
Crowley; Bill Skaggs o f Quanah; Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Mann, Charts, Carla 
Ashlee all o f Pampa; Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Skaggs, Danny, Crystal and 
amie, Justin o f Amarillo; Mr. and 
Mrs. Dean Skaggs, Larry and David 
of Fritch, Fenton Skaggs o f Las 
Vegas; bob Stephens and grand­
daughter o f natalie o f Amarillo; 
Johns and Inez Stephens; J.D. and 
Marie Skaggs and Sherry, Anthony 
and Vicld and Dustin Knowles, Bil! 
and Kay Talley, Josh and Matt all o f 
Hedley. Everyone had a full day of 
visiting and good food.

Hodge’s grandson 

wins 1st place 

at State
Justin Me Lem ore, grandson o f 

Bob and Do!oris Hodge o f Hedley 
won first place in Gass 4A in the 110 
meter hurdles recently in the State 
Track meet in Austin.

Justin is a sophomore st Waxah- 
achie High School.

Justin, who won several track 
meets including district and regional 
this spring, climaxed his years work 
in track with his State Championship.

Justin ran in the 110 meter high 
hurdles against all seniors.

His parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry McLemore o f Waxahachie, Tx.

Needless to say his entire family is 
very proud o f him.

Give your
family:

THE BEST S t

We, as parents, are continually striving to do the best 
that we can for our children. We want them to be in the 
best of health; We want them to obtain the best educa­
tion possible; We want to do what we can to provide the 
best of this world's goods... But Jesus said,

"Fon what doeA i t  p n o f it  a man to  pain the. whole, would and fonfe.Lt 
hiA AoulP Fon what Ahall a man y ive  in  exchange fon hiA aouI ? "

MARK 8 : 36&37
Even if we do manage to give our children the best this old world 

has to offer, and yet we do not give them what they need to obtain 
eternal life... we have failed them miserably!
Why not give your family the VERY BEST: An education in the Word 
of God and a genuine faith in the Lord Jesus Christ... nothing else 
can g'ye them "abundant life" in this present world and the hope of 
"Ufa sternal" in the world to come!!!

The church of Christ 
(3rd and Carhart)

Box 861
Clarendon, Tx 79226 

Ph: 874-2495

Sunday B ib l e  C la ss  . . .  9:30am
Sunday AM Assembly . . .  10:30am 
Sunday PM Assembly . . .  6:00pm
Wednesday C la s s e s  . . .  7:30pm

(a t t e n d e d  n urse ry  a v a i l a b l e )

r  • . / . 
r .  L I c p /?. Stnoua

- e v a n g e l i s t -
- C U t -

’TU C ' M  A ll  Thin La uoun in v ita t io n  to enjoy a ̂elk-. 1 l i l l G  i’e-AAonal Bible. Study, in  the pnivacy,
T C  A  P U p p  comfont and convenience o f  uoun own
*  home! CounAe conAintA o f  /o Aunple,

pnactica l, e x c it in g  "a d u lt"  B ib le  LeAAonA A e n t dinectly to you
thnouyh the m a il_____ Simply f i l l  out the infonmation below and
m ail th in coupon bach in  to  ua:

NAFIF: ___________________________________________________ _ ___
ADimiSS: __________________________________________ ________

(No c o s t  o r  o b l i g a t i o n ! )

Bible Correspondence jfl Course
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The Lions Tale|
by GENE ALDERSON________ I

The Clarendon Lion Club held its 
regular meeting at noon on Tuesday 
•t the Lions Hall. Twenty-six mem­
bers and guests were present. Fol­
lowing regular opening ceremony, 
thanks to Lion Hicks for filling in as 
song leader. Lion Henson introduced 
our guests. Boss Lion Shelton made 
some annoucements and the meeting 
was adjourned.

Burial flag benefit 

explianed by VA
In 1987 the Veterans Administra­

tion issued more than 350,000 Amer­
ican flags for burial or memorial 
purposes. The flags are used to 
drape the caskets o f deceased veter­
ans and are presented to the next o f 
kin or close friend or associate o f the 
deceased. Flags are issued at VA 
regional offices and most local post 
offices.

In recent years, many VA ceme­
teries and other VA facilities have 
adopted an innovative way to honor 
the memory o f those who served 
through the creation o f an “ Avenue 
o f Flags”  program.

Last year alone, over 4,000 flags 
which had been presented to families 
or friends o f deceased veterans, were 
donated to the VA. When a flag is 
donated, a Certificate o f Apprecia­
tion is presented to the donor and the 
flag becomes the property o f the VA.

On roadways or along walkways at 
VA facilities throughout the country, 
standard burial flags are flown from 
uniformly spaced staffs. VA facilities 
which participate in the “ Avenue o f 
Flags”  program erect the display on 
Veterans Day and Memorial Day. 
They may also do so on other days o f 
patriotic observance such as Flag 
Day and Independence Day. I f  more 
flags are received than needed for 
display, a rotation system is used to 
insure they all are eventually flown.

V A ’s Department o f Memorial 
Affairs administers the National 
Cemetery System comprising 111 
national cemeteries in 38 states and 
Puerto Rico. Burial in a national 
cemetery with available grave space 
is open to all veterans discharged 
under conditions other than dishon­
orable, as well as eligible dependents 
o f veterans.

Information on burial flags and 
other benefits is available by contact­
ing thenearest VA office listed in the 
phone directory under U.S. Govern­
ment.

1926 Book 
Club

The 1926 Book Club met Tuesday, 
May 10th for the President’ s Dinner. 
They ate a superb salad meal at 6 
p.m. The hostesses were Carolyn 
Hamilton, Jesse Adam s, Susie 
Shields and Hazel Brandon.

Following the good food and 
enjoyable visiting. President Glenda 
Hpwkins suggested that they support 
the Library Silent Auction by 
ing gifts to be auctioned. Hazel 
Brandon moved that they donate 
S50.00, Carolyn Hamilton seconded 
the unanimously approved motion.

The group expressed appreciation 
for Glenda’s able leadership the past 
two club years.

Members were reminded o f the 
June 14th Club Breakfast at 9:00 
o'clock at the Dairy Queen.

Members present were Jesse 
Adams. Viola Bones, Hazel Brandon, 
Pauline Heath, Glenda Hawkins, 
Pauline M orris. Frieda Tucker, 
Thelma Shields, Lockie Pitts, Elvy 
Shields, Mary Hazel VanZandt, Nell 
Vitarelli, Betty Veach, Nita Foust 
and guest Dorothy Morris.

V A ’s home loan 

guaranty program  

revised
Legislation recently signed by 

President Reagan has made sweep­
ing changes in the Veterans Admin­
istration’s Home Loan Guaranty 
Program, Administrator o f Veterans 
Affairs Thomas K. Tumage has 
announced.

The Veterans’ Home Loan Pro­
gram Improvements and Property 
Rehabilitation Act revised the calcu­
lations for determining the amount of 
the loan guaranteed by the VA. 
Previously, the maximum VA-guar- 
anty on a conventional home loan 
was $27,500. Under the new law, for 
loans o f $45,000 or less, 50 percent o f 
the loan is guaranteed, up to a 
maximum o f $36,000, but not less 
than $22,500. The changes apply to 
any loan closed on or after February 
1, 1988, unless a guaranty commit­
ment was made on or before Dec. 31, 
1987.

In addition, the new law reinstated 
the one percent funding foe on 
VA-backed home loans, effective. 21, 
1987, through Sept. 30, 1989.

Other changes in the loan guaranty 
program include:

•A  limitation on refinancing o f 
existing loans to 90 percent o f the 
appraised value o f the property. This 
limitation takes effect Feb. 20, 1988, 
and does not apply to veterans 
refinancing an existing VA loan with 
a new loan at a lower interest rate.

•A  five percent downpayment of 
VA-guaranteed loans for manufac­
tured homes. This change applies to 
any manufactured home loan closed 
on or after Feb. 1, 1988.

*Restricttons on the assumability 
o f a VA home loan. Veterans 
intending to sell their homes before 
the loan is paid in full must notify the 
lender. If the lender or the VA finds 
the purchaser is not a good credit 
risk, the unpaid balance may be 
declared immediately due and paya­
ble. I f  the purchaser is acceptable, 
the veteran will be released from 
liability to the VA. This change 
applies to loans for which guaranty 
commitments are made on or after 
March 1, 1988.

•A  relaxation o f occupancy re­
quirements for new loans and refi-

R A B B IT ’S
A P P L IA N C E

SE R V IC E
Service All Makes Of Appliances 

Central Heating,
Wall & Floor Furnaces

513 Orpe 874-3632
On Call 6 Days A Week

B. B. (Rabb.it) Osburn

The

nanced loans. For interest rate- 
reduction refinancing loans only, 
previous occupancy by a veteran or 
active-duty service member will now

satisfy the requirement that the 
veteran occupy the home in order to 
be eligible for the VA-backed loan. 
For new loans and other refinancing 
loans, the occupancy o f the spouse o f 
an active-duty service member will 
satisfy the occupancy requirement if 
the member is unable to occupy the 
property because o f his or her duty 
status. These changes apply to loans 
made on or after Jan. 21, 1988.

Further information can be provi­
ded by contacting the nearest VA 
regional office listed in the telephone 
directory under U.S. Government.

The VA Home Loan Guaranty 
Program was established in 1944 as 
part o f the original G1 Bill to help 
returning World War II veterans. 
The program helps veterans finance 
the purchase o f homes at a favorable 
rate o f interest and with little or no 
aownpsyment. Since the program 
began, VA has guaranteed more than 
12 million home loans.

* ,  H

Racks, Tacks 
and Tails

Rack Tack N Tails 4-H Group is 
selling tickets on a beautiful pair o f 
handmade Melton McCowen spurs. 
These spurs are on display at First 
Bank A  Trust. The tickets are $1.00 
each or 12 for $10.00. To buy your 
tickets see Loretta Crump at First 
Bank ft  Trust or any o f the following 
4-H members: CodUee or Monty 
Adams, Donald Gooch, Lee Gage, 
Scott Myers. Chad Campbell, Minde 
Hollar, Johnny Mangum, Lynn 
Wiggs, Justin or Jason Ham, Buddy 
or Donnie Howard. These spurs will 
be given away on July 4th, 1988.

Assembly of God 

annual meeting

The annual meeting o f the Assem­
bly of God was held Sunday evening, 
June 5.

The minutes and financial report 
was read and approved.

A report was given by Elena 
Ramirez, President o f Women’s Min­
istries (W .M .’s) on the accomplish­
ments o f that group for the year. 
Vada Morrison, Sec./Treas. gave the 
financial report. Wanda Rolls gave a 
short report on Joy Fellowship, an 
extension o f W .M .’ s. The Sunday 
School report was given by Johnny 
Jaramillo, S.S. Superintendent. The 
secretary/treasurer, Candy Brown, 
gave the financial report o f the 
Sunday school Department. Pastor 
J.W. Brown reported on the accom­
plishments at the church for the year.

Ballots were handed out for the 
elections o f officers.

E. W . (Red) Morrison was elected 
as a permanent member o f the 
Official Board with full voting rights.

Gary English was elected for a 
three year term on the Board. Johnny 
Jaramillo was elected to finish out 
Efrain Ramirez’s two-year term. Mr. 
Ramirez has resigned as he and his 
family will be moving.

Wanda Rolls was re-elected for a 
two-year term as Church Secretary/ 
Treasurer.

Johnny Jaramillo was re-elected as 
Sunday School Superintendent, and 
Gary English as assistant superin­
tendent.

Candy Brown was re-elected as 
S.S. Sec./Treas.

The church is looking forward to 
another great year o f growth and 
accomplishments.

Farmer and rancher 
meeting

There will be a meeting o f farmer 
and ranchers at Clarendon College, 
Room 102, June 13 at 7:30 p.m. and 
at Lakeview  Elementary School 
Auditorium, June 14 at 7:30 p.m. to 
hear William S. “ Bill”  Williams 
speak on Hope for today’ s farmers, 
rights of the farmers and ranchers, 
FmHA procedures, The Living Trust 
and more. There will be a question 
and answer period.

Mr. Williams is an attorney from 
North Dakota and has been doing 
foreclosure defense work for farmers 
since 1975. Through his many years 
o f working with and for the farmers, 
he has become quite knowledgable in 
the problems that today’s farmers 
and ranchers face. There will be a 
question and answer period after the 
meeting.

Serve Fresh 
Fruits with 
Pound Cake

I f  you  want dessert to be extra 
special, serve the fru it on  Cream 
Cheese Pound Cake. Th is m oist 
varia tion  o f  the classic pound 
cak e  g e ts  its  r ic h n ess  fr o m  
8 ounces o f  cream  cheese.

H ere arc som e help fu l hints fo r  
p reparing  Cream  Cheese Pound 
Cake:

Meet
Larry DeSierra H.A.S.

-  Hearing Consultant -

2nd & 4th Thursday 

10:00a.m .-1 :00 p.m.

BIVENS PHARMACY

Service on all makes & models 
Batteries & Accessories 
Free Hearing Tests

-  No Appointment Necessary -

High Plains 
Hearing Aid Center

-3S5-SM9

C O M E  TO  US FOR YOUR INSURANCE NEEDS 
COMPARE OUR PRICES TO YOUR CURRENT INSURANCE
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Auto Discount 
10%

Homeowners Discount 
25%

Call Us Anytime

N O R P P
In su ra n ce  A g e n c y , Jnc.

(806) 874-3521 Clarendon, Texas

• A ll Ingred ients shou ld be at 
room  tem perature fo r  best 
results.

• Using a pastry brush to grease 
a Bundt pan w ill help assure a 
thorough job without messy 
hands.

• To prevent sticking, leave the 
cake in the pan to cool only 
for the specified time.

• Serve slices o f  Cream  Cheese 
Pound Cake b u ttered  and 
toasted fo r  breakfast.

C ream  Cheese f o s a d  C ake
1 Vi cups (3 sticks) bu tter o r

m argarine, so ftened  
1 package (8  ounces) cream

cheese, at room  tem perature 
3 cups sugar 
6  eggs
1 V4 teaspoons vanilla  
3 cups s ifted  Martha W hite

A ll-Pu rpose F lour 
M teaspoon  salt 
C on fectioners ’ sugar

Preheat oven  to 325° F. G rease 
and flo u r  a 10-inch tube pan o r  
12-cup bundt pan. Beat butter and 
cream  cheese until w e ll b len ded ; 
add sugar and cream  until ligh t 
and flu ffy . Add eggs on e at a time, 
beating w e ll a fte r each add ition . 
B lend in  vanilla. S ift toge th er 
flou r and salt; b lend into cream ed 
m ix tu re . S p oo n  b a t te r  In to  
prepared pan. Bake 1 hour 10 m in­
utes o r  until toothp ick  Inserted ih 
cen ter com es out clean. C oo l in 
pan 5 minutes; turn ou t on to  w ire  
rack and c o o l com plete ly . Dust 
w ith  c o n fe c t io n e r s ’ sugar, i f  
desired.

Additional pound cake recipes, 
such as Chocolate Chocolate Chip 
Pound Cake, m ay be ob ta in ed  by 
w ritin g  fo r  the “ Pound Cakes”  
le a f le t  a t th e  M arth a  W h ite  
K itchen, RO. B ox 58, D ept. P f,  
Nashville, TN  37202.

Customer relations 
key to businesses l>

“ Word o f mouth”  often can 
“make”  or “ break”  a retail busi­

ness. Research indicates that a 
dissatisfied customer typically tells 
about 10 other people, and most 
retailers, especially in smaller towns, 
can not afford to lose that much 
business.

The key to a successful retail 
business is customer satisfaction, 
says Dr. Don Stebbins. Recent 
surveys show that it’s not unusual for 
consumers in small towns to spend 
more than half o f their income In 
larger cities, notes Stebbins, a 
community development specialist 
with the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, The Texas A ftM  Uni­
versity System? To a large extent, 
higher prices are not the problem. If 
necessary, most consumers are will-

i d
ude

ing to pay slightly higher | 
support local merchants if 
satisfied in other ways.

That means excellent 
relations - a low coat, effective 
for merchants to keep present 
tomers and gain new ones.

Good “ word o f mouth”  
ing is the cheapest and best ad' 
ing that a merchant can get, ei ip 
sizes the specialist. More 
need to do a better job and makj i 
that satisfied customers are 
ing the word.

Good customer relations 
asking questions to understaij cus­
tomer needs. Many times cus mers 
need assistance in selectir the 
correct model, size or quality o lome 
product. It’s important to now 
enough about the product to hi > the 
customer make the best choic*

A  sincere smile on the fact of a 
courteous, well groomed sales| rson 
who is giving a customer full 
attention can make a fav< tble 
impression. On the other ban an 
indifferent attitude by the lies 
person can easily send a custon r to 
a competitior.

Even the best managed ston will 
occasionally have a dissatisfied us- 
tomer.

Experts in customer relation! tell 
us that there are effective waj to 
deal with the irate person. The iost 
important thing is to allow ithe 
unhappy customer to upress his 
feelings and then find a; agreerile 
solution.

Stebbins advises comminity busi­
ness leaders to take the fcitiative in 
encouraging and i 
to adopt unproved custom*} relations 
procedures..

Everyone in the commuity bene­
fits if the retail trade ail service 
sector is pleasing to cctomers. 
Businesses are more likev to be 
profitable, customers hapier and 
jobs in retailing more secie. And 
more dollars stay in town to>ossibly 
create more job opportunitic.

Community development j 
ists with the Texas Ag 
Extension Service offer tra^ng in 
customer relations. Interest^ mer­
chants can contact their local (punty 
Extension Agent to arrangea tuning 
program.

OWENS 
BOOTSHOP

DAY
CALVARY BAPTIST 

CHURCH

June 12th
Starting at 10:00 a.m.

Events of the day will include

★  Special 10:00 & 11:00 service
★  Dinner on the grounds - BBQ 

chicken & all the trimmings
★  Special outside afternoon 

service
if  Old Fashioned Preaching
★  Old Fashioned Gospel Quartet
it  Pony rides, hay rides, washer 

tosses, horseshoe throws, 
sack races, Tug-O-W ar 
Contests, e tc ...

i t  Everyone is Invited to come 
and wear your Old Fashioned 
duds

it  A Nursery will be providedeeling nostalgic for the good olddays? Come to our Old-Fashioned extravaganza
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ASSORTED
CHOPS

PURE
VEGETABLE

dSTBJHBH)
CHKStFOOl

SINGLES
AiMEMCAN
fU D W IW S W S *  1

ASSORTED VARIETIESBATHROOM ASSORTED AMERICAN/ PIM ./SW ISS

FRITO'S BRAND

ITENDERCRUST

BORDEN'S

SHURFINE WNOUKMNAIO*
O B  CM A* STYII 16 OZ. 

CANS
SHURFINE

8 OZ. 
CANS

BANQUET

KEEBLER

LUCKY LEAF 6-12 OZ. CANS
FRESH SWEET BIRDSEYE "F A R M  FRESH ASSTD

DELMONTE

CATSUP
SHURFINE

Q u a r r y
m

v a l u e  a l y w s
GRADE A MEDIUM

TEXAS FRESH YELLOW/ ZU C C H IN I

W HITE R A IN  ASSORTED

DOZEN

W HITE R A IN  ASSTD AEROSOl PLAIN'S

C0TTA6E

AFFILIATED 
FOODS INC.

MONDAY-SATURDAY
8t00-9t00
SUNDAY
BtM-AiBO

PRICES EFFEC TIVE

SIN G L

DAIRY D ELIG H TSH E A L TH  & B E A U TY

m < £ g j
G U m  A PASTEURIZED 1

c u lt u r e d
b u t t e r m ilk
e*i mu :»n:«

ALL PURPOSE

6 L A M O L A  

F L O U R  S ' 6 9 '

1 FROZEN

r ~ "N
40* OFF LABEL

LAUNDRY

CHEER
DETERMENT

42 OZ. BOX

$ 169



1988 - Eighth grade graduation at Clarendon Junior High School
Clarendon Junior High held its 

annual Awards Day Assembly at the 
Harned Sisters Fine Arts Auditorium 
on Friday, May 27. The Eighth Grade 
Class o f 1988 were honored guests.

After Mrs. Thelma Shields played 
the Processional, Lydia Black, 
highest ranking girl in the class, gave 
the Invocation. She was followed by 
Kelly Edwards who led the “ Pledge 
o f A llegiance". Principal FloydGuinn 
welcomed the crowd and Danny 
Smith gave the Salutatory.

Mrs. Thelma Shields presented 
the 1926 Book Club’s Citizenship 
Awards to Christy Smith and Scott 
Hankins. Scott then gave the Vale­
dictory.

Top students in the various subject 
areas were announced. Miss Lynn 
Mathiason presented Suzzette Hen­
son with the Mathematics Award. 
Mrs. Cherry Adams gave the Read­
ing and Spelling Award to Jodi Kidd 
and Mrs. Helen Estlack named Scott 
Hankins the recipient o f the English 
Award. Mrs. Beth Sharp introduced 
Scott Hankins as the winner o f the 
History Award, and Mr. Carrol 
Duncan gave the Science Award to 
Toni Breitling. Mrs. Thelma Shields 
presented the Music Award to Buddy 
Howard, and Mr. Eddie Hankins 
introduced Suzzette Henson as the 
top Band student. ,

A t this point the Eighth Grade 
Class o f 1988, represented by Jodi 
Kidd and Chance Fletcher, presen­
ted gifts to Mrs. Beth Sharp, whome 
they had selected as Favorite Teach-

below 80 on their report cards and 
with no grade below 85 in deport­
ment. Honor “ C”  Awards were 
presented to sixth graders: Monty 
Adams, Casey Alexander, Stacey 
Alexander, Cara Breitling, Greg 
Collins, Lisa Hill, Deana Nazworth. 
Christiana Hom m el, Ash ley 
Knorpp and Carrie Shields. Seventh 
graders receiving the award were 
Kim Altman, Chan Bilbrey, Sheri 
Hall and Lydia Black. Eighth graders 
earning the Honor “ C”  Award were 
K e lly  Edwards, Scott Hankins, 
Buddy Howard, Danny Smith and 
Christy Smith.

Mr. Guinn presented the following 
eighth grade students to the audi­
ence: Shane Ashcraft, Stephen 
Bivens, Lydia Black, Toni Breitling, 
Lashel Calloway, Luis Camacho, Clay 
Christopher, Lalanya Douthit, 
Amber Dunham, Kelly Edwards, 
Michelle Farmer, Chance Fletcher, 
Lee Gage, Scott Hankins, Suzzette 
Henson, Cindy Hermesmeyer, Kim 
H odges, Buddy Howard, Lori 
Howard, Lori Howard, Larry Jaramil- 
lo, Phil Jaramillo, Jodi Kidd, Robert 
Lee, Scharla Lee per, Doran Lindsey, 
Nathan Lowrie, Maria Lucero, Kim 
McAfee, Sammy Matheson, Jimmy 
Milhoan, Dennis Miller, Matt Moor­
ing, Danny Smith, Christy Smith, 
Hugo Vaquera, Christina White, 
Margaret Williams, Stanley Wilson 
and Ron Winters.

Mr. Jeff Walker, Superintendent, 
welcomed the class to Clarendon 
High School and challenged them to 
set even higher goals. Toni Breitling 
offered a poem as the Benediction, 
and Mrs. Shields closed the assem­
bly with the recessional.

BUDDY HOWARD, Music

I f  t
SUZZETTE HENSON, Band, Math P la y  D a y  

P ic tu re s
STANLEY WILSON Perfect Attendance

And I st 
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Mr. Guinn then presented Stanley 
Wilson, an eighth grader, with a 
Perfect Attendance Award. Also 
receiving Perfect Attendance were: 
Carey Thornberry and Byron Burrow 
from  K indergarten ; Eduardo 
Vaquera and Kirsten Bertrand from 
1st Grade; Jessie Shelley, Melisse 
Campbell, Dawn McAnear, and 
Clarissa Smith from 2nd Grade; 
Nathan Koontz, Robert Bertrand, 
Wade James, Chris Chamberlain and 
Tangelia Smith from 3rd Grade; 
Jacob Smith, Amy Thornberry, and 
Lashonda Smith from 4th Grade; 
Justin Griffin, E.J. Ramirez, Jenni­
fer Simpson, Danny Wilson, Sabrina 
Burrow, Mandy Floyd, Michael 
McKinney and Suzy Williams from 
5th Grade.

He also gave out Honor “ C "  
Awards to all the students in 
Clarendon Junior High who had 
maintained a 90 or better average 
in each class with no grade

CHRISTY SMITH AND SCOTT HANKINS, Citizenship

The following students made the 
“ A "  Honor Roll for the sixth six 
weeks.

1st grade: Kim Alexander, Kyle 
Crabtree, Leia Deyhle, Lindsay 
Green, Debi Hall, Tracy Hankins, 
Nathan Sears, Amy Smith, Travis 
Sumter, Kirsten Bertrand, Tiffanie 
Hollan, Jodie Lockeby, Sara 
Newhouse, Derek Shields, Johnnie 
Sparks and Kara Thomson.

2nd grade: Christina Wootten and 
Chandra Ford.

3rd grade: Scctt Bivens, Catrina 
Burrow, Bobbye Jean Faires, Mar­
garet McNabb, Xitlali Menchaca. 
Liza Tull, Korey Knorpp and Nathan
Koontz.

4th grade: Amanda Ballard, 
Joshua Shields, Lashonda Smith, 
Aaron Ashcraft, Jeffier Garrison, 
Jason Lee, Jacob Smith, Roger Smith 
and Amy Thornberry.

5th grade: Beth Barbee, E. J. 
Ramirez, Jennifer Simpson. Amanda 
W ard, Julie A ltman, Sabrina 
Burrow, Heidi Gennan, Mandy 
Floyd, Donny Howard, and Suzy 
Williams.

6th grade: Casey A lexander, 
Stacey, Alexander, Cara Breitling, 
Greg Collins, Deana Nazworth, and 
Charlie Smith.

7th grade: Chan Bilbrey and 
Bobbie Havens.

8th grade: Toni Breitling, Kelly 
Edwards, Scott Hankins, Christy 
Smith, Suzzette Henson and Buddy 
Howard.
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AB Honor Roll
The following students made the 

“ A B " Honor Roll for the sixth six 
weeks.

1st grade: Cindy Hearn, Steve 
Jaramillo, Audra Kirkland, Lacey 
Quimby, Eduardo Vaquera, Chad 
Wright, Kenna Ellis, Mark Howard, 
Blake Osburn and Stephanie Smith.

2nd grade: Jayson Adams, Blake 
Deyhle, Lafonda Estes, Laura Finch, 
Bethany Garrison, Aaron Haper, 
Mary Hodges, Keith Kidd, Jessica 
Rogers, Jessie Shelley, Amanda 
Weatherton, Nichole Wendlandt, 
Matthew Ariola, Melisse Campbell, 
Pati Ceniceros, Dawn McAnear, 
Jenny Roberts, Ka&i Ashcraft, Gina 
Cannon, Dewayne Chilton, Candi 
Hoggard, Brandon Irvin, Walker 
McAnear, Gina Ramirez and Bradley 
Stewart.

3rd grade: Jana Breitling, Chris 
Chamberlain, Laura Hommel, Jason 
Morrow, Drrick Shafer, Tanaelia

SHERI HALL, 7th Honor C

8th GRADE GRADUATING CLASS

Citizenship

Awards
Drrick Shafer 

Smith, Robert Bertrand, Will Boston, 
Missie Butts, Kyle Davis. Stephanie 
Floyd, Bill Hamilton, JaMychael 
Irvin, Jennifer McGain, Kathryn 
Ritchie, and Heather Shields.

4th grade: Jennifer Hatley, Lana 
M o ffe tt, Somer Harper, Kristy 
Hankins, Adrian Dunn, Jeremy 
Woodruff, Louis EUerbrook, Codilee 
Adams, Gint Green, Christy Byrd, 
Jason Christopher, Stephanie Davis, 
Daniel Grizzel, Lynn Hearn, April 
Hommel, Mandy M cAnear, 
Samantha Mincey and Evan W il­
liams.

5th grade: Jesse Chilton, Jason 
Dunn, Justin G riffin , M atthew 
Grizzel, Randy Haire, Angie Walker, 
Jessica Wendlandt, Danny Wilson, 
Kimberly Wootten, Tim Hall. Haley 
Hamilton, Todd Lindley, Michael 
McKinney and Giffton Moore.

6th grade: Ben Ballard, Rebecca 
Cam pbell, Tommy Chadwick, 
Faustino Camacho, Jeremy Grady, 
Christiana Hommel, Ashley Knorpp, 
Ernie Lee, Elaine McDaniels, Carrie 
Shields, W esley Smith, Monty 
Adams, Chad Cam pbell, Amy 
Koontz, Tim Landon, and Trey Tull.

M RS. BETH SH AR P, Favorite 
teacher

Clarendon Elementary and Junior 
High School Citizenship awards were 
presented for the sixth six weeks. 
Those receiving awards were:

Kindergarten-R. Duncan’s class 
Heather Pasco and Josh Hawkins; K. 
Simmons class, Patricia Sisemore 
and Hunter Spier.

lst-E. Ellcrbrook’ s class, Tracy 
Hankins and Steve Jaramillo; F. 
Tucker’s class, Kara Thomson and 
Mark Howard.

2nd -G. Guinn’s class, Jessica 
Rogers and James Thomas; G. 
Hankins’ class, Nicki Lumpkin and 
Chris Taylor; F. Moreman’s class. 
Lindsey Eads and Bradley Stewart.

3rd-N. Jones’ class, Tangelia 
Smith and Jason Morrow; H. Land’ s 
class, Bili Hamilton and Kyle Davis.

4th-B. Gooch's class, Amanda 
Ballard and Jeremy Woodruff; T. 
Mooring’ s class, Aaron Ashcraft and 
Jason Christopher.

5th-J. Campbell’s class, Angie 
W alker and Corey Fields; M . 
Nelson’s class, Haley Hamilton and 
Donny Howard.

6th-L. Mathiason's class, Faustino 
Camacho and Christina Guinn; C. 
Duncan’s class Cara Breitling. 

Krista Perciva l, Tracy 7th-H. Estlack's class, Sonya 
scy Thomas, Jason Ward. Wright and Shane Judd; K. Hatley’s 
e: Luis Camacho, Stephen class. Kelli Keown and Jeff Hatley, 
ydia Black, Megan Wil- 8th-B. Sharp’s class, Cindy Her- 
■ Gage, Jimmy Milhoan, mesmeyer and Luis Camacho; C. 
ard, Jodi Kidd. Matt Adams’ class. Suzzette Henson and 
4athan Lowrie and Danny Buddy Howard.

6th HONOR C Monty Adams, Casey 
Alexander, Stacey Alexander, Cara 
Breitling, Greg Collins, Lisa HOI,

Christiana Hommel, Ashley Knorpp, 
Deana Nazworth and Carrie Shields.

SCOTT HANKINS, History . English
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Local
Charlotte Paul, Ph-d IN  progesaor and chairperson of the 

University of Edinboro, Penn., and her husband Robert and their 
two children Peter and Lora spent a week in Clarendon visiting her 
grandmother, Roeda Rattan, her mother Sebyl Rattan Jones and her 
brother Ricky Ration and her unde John Rattan and their families. 
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PARADE TIME

Page 9

It wl
TIM E!!!

the Fenrth of July and that n a n  PARADE

Jnfy 4th. Una a *
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i M the Tri-State Aren are 

activities. W e

And 1 saw a new heaven. . .
1. There may be a tabernacle (Rev.
15:5; 21:3).

2. There will be no temple (Rev.
2 1 :22) .

3. There will be no sea (Rev. 21:1).
4. There will be no tears (Rev. 

7:17; 21:4).
5. There will be no sickness (Rev.

22:2).
6. There will be no pain (Rev.

21:4).
7. There will be no death (Isa. 

25:8; 1 Cor. 15:26; Rev. 21:4).
8. There will be no more thirst or 

hunger (Rev. 7:16).
9. There will be no more sin (Rev. 

21:27).
10. There will be no more judg­

ment upon sin (Rev. 22:3).
11. There will be no need for the 

sun or moon (Rev. 21:23).
12. There will be no night (Rev. 

21:25; 22:5)..
13. The dty will be the bride­

groom’s gift to the bride, Christ’ s 
church (Rev. 21:2, 10).

14. tt will be shared by saved Israel 
(Heb. 11:10, 16).

15. tt will be shared by the holy 
angels (Dan. 7:10; Heb. 12:22; Rev. 
5:11).

16. The Father will be there (Dan. 
7:9; Rev. 4:2-3).

17. The Son will be there (Rev. 5:6; 
7:17).

18. The Holy Spirit will be there 
(Rev. 14:13; 22:17).

Farm Bureau 
News

l he Texas Farm Bureau and five of 
its members have filed suit against 
Secretary at Agriculture Richard 
Lyng and the USDA, seeking indu- 
sion o f hay as a pershable crop under 
the Immigration Reform and Control 
ad  of 1986.

In a letter to Lyn, TFB President 
S.M. Tru o f Plain view, explained 
that hay is ‘ ‘perishable, labor in­
tensive, and has critical and un­
predictable labor demands.”  True 
said Hay’s inclusion as a perishable 
crop will alleviate serious labor 
problems experienced by hay pro­
ducers.

Hall-Donley County Farm Bureau 
President M elv in  Srygley said, 
“ making hay a perishable crop will 
make it eligible for the Special Agri- 
ultural Workers (SAW ) program. 
This is a chance to help livestock 
producers who have been shut out o f 
this important source o f labor.”

A similar suit was filed in Lubock 
last year seeking inclusion o f cotton 
in the A d . That suit resulted in 
cotton being classified as a fruit, 
making it eligible for the SAW 
program. The five plantiffs joining 
texas Farm Bureau is the suit are 
Surphur Sprins dairyman Don Smith, 
trinity cattleman Russ Arnold, ran­
cher James Wood o f Gilmer, and 
Warren and Anna Madson, ranchers 
from McLennan County.

BLUEBERRY CR EAM  CHEESE PIE

I I /4 C. graham cracker crumbs 
1/2 C. melted butter or margarine 
1/4 C. firmly packed brown sugar 
I /4 C. ground pecans 
1/2 tsp. cinnamon 
I ( 8  0 7 . )  pkg. softened cream cheese 
I (14 07.) can sweetened condensed milk 
1/3 C. lemon juice
1 tsp. vanilla
2 C. fresh blueberries 
1/2C. sugar
I 1/2 T. cornstarch 
I 1/2 T. lemon juice 
1/3 C. water

Preheat oven  to 350 degrees F. 
Combine cracker crumbs, butter, 
brown sugar, pecans and cinnamon. 
Press into 9-inch pie pan. Bake 5-10 
minutes or until lightly brown; cool. 
Cream softened cream cheese with 
e lec tr ic  m ixer. A dd  sw eetened 
condensed milk, 1/3 cup lemon juice 
and vanilla, blending until smooth. 
Pour into cooled crust. Chill 2-3 hours. 
M eanw hile, com bine b lueberries, 
sugar, cornstarch, I 1/2 tablespoons 
lemon juice and water. Cook over 
medium heat until boiling mixture is 
thickened and clear. Cool. Spread 
evenly over top o f pie. Makes 10 
servings.

PLEASE CUP AND RETURN ENTRY FORMS BELOW TOt 
CHAMBER OF COMMERCE 

P.O. Bax 730 
Claraadaa, Taxaa 79226 

Phase 806-874-2421
PA R A D E  E N T R Y  FORM

> N a m e :

Z i p :

P h o n e :

F o r  P a r a d e  A n n o u n c e r

F I D D L E R S  C O N T E S T  EN TR Y

N a m e :

A d d r e s s

C i t y :  

P h o n e

Z i p :

DO COUNTRY

SPECIALS FORJUNE 8 - JULY 3
FREE PERSONALIZED 
COFFEE MUG!

Join the DQ Mug Club and get a 
free ceramic coffee mug with your 
name on it. All it takes is 10 break­
fast purchases at a participating 
Dairy Queen store.

SAUSAGE ^BISCUIT 59c
A thick slice o f sausage on a fresh, flaky DQ biscuit- 
served up hot just for you! And right now, just for 594!

t« s  OUK Neiv, h())

COUNTRY

Hwy.287 
Cljrtmion, TX

|»IK* Ti-V IU|. Op OlHV •: kilt. TM Tv*. tl.Q.llp. 1 mm K< t> TM \M I Ml Owr

AL MORRAH 
SHRINE CLUB

WILL BE
SPONSORING THE 

JULY 4th

BARBECUE 

TICKETS ARE 

$4.00 a plate 

- serving from 

11 a.m. until ?

AFM24
Quasar Camcorder 

Full Size 

Camera & Tape

With Case, Power Supply

& Wireless Mike

WJll Also 

Be Given Away

A. R. Henson, John Sarich

Or Any

A1 Morrah Shrine Club

Member
For

Information
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Classified ad rates are $?.50 for 15 
words or lees, 10 cents per word over 
15 words. Cards of thanks, average 
length Is $4.00. Subscription rate In 
Donley County b  $13.00 a year. 
Subscriptions for outside o f Donley 
County and out of state are $16.00 a 
year. Six month subscriptions are 
$8.00 and three month subscriptions 
ere $6.00. Display ads on request.

A  $1.00 charge will be added If 
statements are sent on classified ads.
' I f  you want your classified ad 

blocked, there will be an 
$1.00 charge on the first ad.

AL MORRAH SHRINE CLUB Board
o f Directors meet on the 1st Tuesday 
of each month at the First Bank and 
Trust Hospitality Room 7:30 p m 
The dub meets every 3rd Monday, at 
7:30 p.m. in the Clarendon Masonic 
Lodge.
John Sarich President
Roy Jeffrey Vice President

Bill Nidiffer Secretary

CLARENDON LODGE #700AF/AM
Stated Meeting: 2nd Monday each 
month 8:00 p.m.
Practice Sessions: 1st & 4th Mondays 
Mike Buns W M  
Willard Skelton Secretary 
Refreshments served at 7:00 p.

FOR SALE: new and used aero motor 
windmills and parts. Submersible 
pump, stock tanks, water well dril­
ling and service, custom hay hauling. 
John Morrow 874-2704.

51-tfc

HELP WANTEDi W e will train you. 
Sewing Plant in Quitaque need 
mature couples-men-women-small 
town-3 minutes to work, low living 
costs Call 806-4&5-1265, 874-5141 
8:30-5:00 Monday-Friday.

21-tfc

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 2 bedroom 
furnished house, Howardwick, 202 
Angel, living room, dining room, 
den, large family room, garage 
874-5150.

43-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom, 1 bath, 
country home on 5 acres, 1 mile east 
of Hedley. Central air and heat, built 
in stove and microwave. 259-3554.

42-tfc

FOR RENT: 1 bedroom house 620 S. 
Taylor call 806-359-9395.

20-tfc

PLUMBER, B ee trie Ian Handyman
David Lane 874-2608.

20- 4tp

NURSES AIDES Day and evening 
shift needed. LVN Flexible hours. 
Contact Diane Hill 226-5121.

20-2tc
CRUISE SHIPS Now H iringl 
Summer and Career opportunities. 
Excellent pay. World Travel! Call ( 
(Refundable) 1-518-459-3734 Ext. P

21- 3tp

GET PAID for reading books!
$100.00 per title. Write: PASE- 
D1160, 161 S. Lincolnway, N.
Aurora. IL 60542.

20-4 tp

ELECTR ICAL AND  PLUM BING  
REPAIRS Bill Riley 28 years exper­
ience. parts and service-24 hours. No 
job too small or too large. 874-5150.

22-tfc

GARAGE SALE SIGNS FOR SALE:
30”  by 15”  stand-up cardboard 
signs. Place for time and directions 
$3.00 The Print Shoppe 874-2711.

19-tfc

FOR SALEi 18 ft. cattle trailer, new 
floor Call 874-2674.

23-ltp

FOR SALE
Houses In Clarendon, and 

Howardwick. Lots o f new listings 
Call us, we need listings

874-2533
SANDERS REAL ESTATE 

720 South McClelland
874-2533

W ANTEDi Lady or girl who can cook 
(2) meals daily for an elderly couple, 
clean modern (2) bedroom house. 
Carpeted and has dishwasher. Top
Pay 856-5373.

22-4tp
FOR SALEi 7 boxer pups, 4 females 
and 3 males, 9 weeks old AKC 
registration, fawn in color 874-5230.

22-4tc
LVN and Medication Aide wanted 
Memphis Convalescent Center 1415 
N. 18th Memphis 259-3566.

2-4tc

HERITAGE

KORiOT 8BRVIKBB
JOHN D & LOIS McVICKER 

119 Walleye — Howardwick, Texas 
KIRBY SALES AND SERVICE 

All Makes Rebuilt Vacuum Cleaners 

Carpet Cleaning for 
Free Estimate Call

HOUTE 2, BOX 105 

CLARENDON. TEXAS 79226

M E D IC A L  CENTER NURSING 
HOME is taking applications for 7-3 
and 11-7 relief L.V.N. Also taking 
applications for nurses aides on all 
shifts. Call Sue Leeper at 874-3760.

23-3tc
NOTICE

Sue Williams has not sold her 
house in Hedley to Johnnie Wilson.

________________  23-ltc
COCKER SPANIELS for $100.00, 6 
weeks, old (Buff colored), call 856- 
5402 after 2:30 p.m. subject to 
register.

23-ltc
W AN T  TO BUY 3 point rotory hoe. 
Howard Fuqua. 352-1609.

23-4tc
FOR SALEi 1982 GMC 6.2 Diesel 
pickup y* ton; also 1980 Chevy. 
Citation 4 door automatic V6 looks 
and runs good. See at K& T Garage 
Phone 874-3446 or 874-5104.

23-2tc

FOR SALEi Sofa, chair and dresser. 
Call after 5 p.m. 874-2297.

23-ltc
FOR SALEi Cocktail table and 2 end 
tables call 874-3408.

LAW N MOW ING Kim and Scott7 
Lewis 874-5029.

23-lt

DR. JACK L. ROSE
!20 S. 10th

Optometrist 
Ph. 259-2216 Memphis

P ' i  874-5024
I

GREENBELT
CLEANERS

Levis &  Shirts

Professional 
DryCleaning^

Brown-McMurtry Implement
PHONE 806-823-2441

BOX 777
SILVERTON, TEXAS 79257

DON BROWN 
Home Ph. 823-2292

SALES k SERVICE

CLARENCE WARD 
Home Ph. 823-2083

ALLEN ESTLACK
Mfc Electrical and Appliance Repair 

Call 874-3683 Box 596 

-" Bonded 8 Licensed

BOB M A J O R  REAL  ESTATE

*£S)D£NTAl FARM RANCH 
709 SONO ST. 8i)X 3S7 
ClARCNDON TEXAS 79226 806 87. 2210
4WO VEHICLE A ANSWERING SERVICE)

M A R m m m M W R R R A N R R R R R R R W W R R R N R R R R N M M IM tM IM IR W IR l

Terrace Building
All Types of Dirt Work

Motor Grader and Bulldozer
Contact

Buddy Ford 87 4 -2 6 5 7  or Steve Rogers 874-5184

, oeoooeeeeeooooooo—ooeoooeooeeoeeeeoooeoeoeeeooooeeoeeoeooeooo#'

Bailey Estes & Son
Welding Fabricating & Steel Buildings 

-also self storage units for 
RENT $25°° month

T E R M IT E  P R O B L E M S
Call for beat termite control 
Over 20 yean  experience 
Call collect 383-7075

3606 N.E. 23rd
», Texas 79107 

State Lie. No. 1178

LEO RUSSELL

. A i d d e o s

&  W  L U M B E R
874-2000

Repair Storm Doors- 
G  lass-S c re e n s

0ham6e/i£atn M O T O R  C O M P A M Y

HIGHWAY 287 CLARENDON, TEXAS 
BUICK*OLDSMOBILE 

PONTIAC*CADILLAC*GMC TRUCKS

FRED CLIFFORD 
Home Phone 
(806) 674-2415

Clarendon (80b) 874-3527
Amanllu 376-9041
Texas WATS (800) 692 4088

Starting Monday, May 16,1988
Monday Nlght-M exkan Food

Tuesday Night-Fried Chicken 
Ho

$4»
Wednesday N ight-Pizza Buy one-get

t
Thursday Night—Spaghetti I  

Friday Night-Fish

$ 4 *

free

Garlic Bread

C___ 1-1Y p e c i t i

5:00-8:30 p
starts «U 5 p.m .
) p.m/each night

THE
Saturday and Sunday Regular menu

874-5070
T20 W . 2nd C larendon Texas BOX I

?
BUYERS AND SELLERS

All
Kinds off Grain 

70 Ft. Scales . 
Ilarendon Grain! 
Elevators, Inc.

J .  R . G IL L
P.O. Box 805 

Clarcqdon) Te*. 79226 
874-3172

A l l  c la s s ifie d  ads  
m u s t b e  p a id  fo r  

in a d v a n c e . .
806 - 874-2259

HALF PRICE! Flashing arrow signs 
S299I Lighted, non-arrow $2891 
Unlighted $2491 Free letters! See 
locally. Call today! Factory: 1 (800) 
423-0163, anytime.

11-ltp

FOR SALEi 2 bedroom, 2 bath 
Mobile home. Call after 6 p.m. 
874-3850.

23-ltp
FOR SALEi Trailers, car trailer, 
Honda 4-wheeler, size 70, Kawasaki 
size 80, Exxon Service Station. See 
Fred.

23-ltc
FOR SALEi 1 sofa. 3 evaporative air 
conditioners $75.00, one almost new 
$200.00; 1 refrigerated window unit 
$90.00 R. S. Patrick Brice 867-2002.

23-ltp
PIANO FOR SALEi Upright antique 
Birds eye maple $350.00 or best offer 
874-3227.

23-2tp

FOR SALEi Trail Blazer, Cickle Bar 
Mower 874-2791.

23-ltp
CRP GRASS M OW ING Bobby L. 
Thomas, 806-447-2809 Wellington. 
W e need and appreciate your busi­
ness.

23-5tp
CARPORT SALEi Lots o f clothes, 
household items, and a lot o f misc. 
215 Goodnight Street. Thursday and 
Friday 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. No Early 
Birds.

23-ltc
YARD SALEi Corner o f Barcus and 
Gorst (across from old rest home) 
large assortment clothes, sporting 
goods, books, records, toys, miscel­
laneous. Saturday 9 until 5 and 
Sunday afternoon.

23-ltp

PORCH SALEi Boy’ s clothes, infant 
to toddler, plus. One mile east 287. 
South on airport road. Saturday.

23-ltc
GARAGE SALEi 112 Swanson Street 
Howardwick. Linens, blankets, 
dishes and lots more goodies. Friday, 
Saturday and Sunday.

_________________23-ltp

LARGE GARAGE SALE Some furni­
ture, clothes and lota o f misc. items. 
415 Jefferson Friday and Saturday 8
a.m.

23-ltp
GARAGE SALEi 2 violins, electric 
amplifier, maple drop leaf table with 
6 chairs, Early American love seat, 
etc. DC Case tractor, Ferguson 3 
point 2 row cultivator, pin foot krouae 
tandem disc., tires, other farm 
related items Friday and Saturday 9 
a.m. Goodnight, TX. 944-5270.

23-ltc
GARAGE SALE i Misc. and clothes. 
Friday and Saturday 9-4 702 Carhart.

23-ltp

A  SPECIAL THANKS

The Kiri and Family would like to 
give a special thank you to the 
Associated Ambulance Authority and 
the Sheriff Department o f Clarendon 
for their assistance with the birth o f 
our daughter Lauren Eiyse.

To Mrs. Becky Lane, Bryan Leep­
er and Tammy Taylor a very special 
thank-you for your concern, support 
and help int he delivery o f the baby.

W e are indebted to all for their 
help, Thank you and God Bleaa.
Hulon , Nancy, Audra, Dreu, Lauren

TH A N K  YOU 231tp
There are no words in which to 

express our gratitude for the love and 
concern shown to us by the people o f 
Clarendon and especially the Calvary 
Baptist Church during the illness and 
death o f Lee Roy Johnson. Each act 
o f kindness is deeply appreciated. 
May God’s richest blessings be your 
reward.

Edna Johnson 
Mr. and Mrs. Buddy Ford 
Mr. and Mrs. Troy Jones 

Mr. and Mrs. Frankie McKinney 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Johnson 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Johnson 
TH AN K  YOU

Your prayers and kind expressions 
o f sorrow at the death o f our husband 
and father are deeply appreciated. 
Thank you for your concern.

The family o f Wilton E. Lynn

W.B. Specialties
"The Modelers Shop" ,

4th and Kearney Streets (Rebekah Building) 

Clarendon .T exas79226

CORNELL REAL ESTATE
Featuring......

•VERY nice 3 bdrm, \Vt bath brick In W ert Clarendon. Priced te 
aeffl at $42,580. Comer lot-fenced-covered potto-new carpet.

•3 bdrm, 2 full bath mobile-covered patio, shop, central beat/air, 
ALL THE EXTRAS-Owner most seO at tedneed price $30,006. W1B 
finance half.

•Cozy, pretty 3 bdrm-large kitchen, fireplace, Btfflty-ama 
See this one!

*2 bdrm-Living/Kitchen combination-perfect first 
couple or small family, looks like a “  
convenience o f town!

Call: Carol Hinton 
874-3649 or 874-3148

Dude Cornell-Broker 

874-3377 or 874-3320

W e need some GOOD 
and Lake Homes as oar

Carol or Dade TODAY If von are

Whether yoa are buying e 
contact ue today

FOR SALE

THIS 5 ROOM HOUSE AT 410 Barcaa, 
Clarendon, In top condition, on four city Iota, 
carport, atom  cellar, storm windows, carpet­
ed, air conditioned, 6”  cooed water well, aleo 
city water and sewer. Some fruit and mUmAm 
trees, small tool house.

$24,500.00 with reasonable down and approvec 
credit • Owner Financed.

Cash Sale Price ia Negotiable.
▼

Agent 806-874-2533
_____________Owner 505-587-2254



NOTIFICATION 
dice Is 

Isf aR
la the United States by tbs

> Agency te 4b C F I
141.34.

Lead levels in yoar 
sic likely to be hlghestt 

■If yoar home c

Appllcatleas 
5:00 | 

E Q U A L  
EMPLOYER. ^

DHS office,
THE

*04/374-7214. 
will be accepted 
.m. Jane 14, 19*8. 
O P P O R T U N IT Y

The

PEACH UPSIDE DOW N CAKE

1/4 C. butter or margarine 
1/2 C. firmly packed bro»n sugar 
I 1/2 C. peeled and sliced peaches
1 1/2 C. sifted cake flour 
3/4 C. sugar
2 tsp. baking powder 
1/2 tsp. salt
I/3C. shortening 
2/3 C. milk 
2 eggs
I tsp. vanilla

In 350-degree F. oven melt butter in 
9-inch cake pan. Remove from oven; 
sprinkle brown sugar evenly in pan and 
place peaches over sugar. Sift flour, 
sugar, baking powder and salt into 
large bowl. Add shortening, mixing 
well with electric mixer. Add milk, eggs 
and vanilla. Beat at low speed just until 
mixed. Beat at high speed about 4 
minutes or until smooth and fluffy. 
Spoon over peaches. Bake in 350- 
degree F. oven 45-50 minutes or until 
cake springs back when lightly pressed 
with finger. Serve warm or at room 
temperature. Makes 6-8 servings.

•If the I

-If yea 
-if

■oft or 
eite to the

i’a water la wcO below 
for lead aad la

to yoa. However, tap 
ligher leveia of 
plpee hi

806-874-3770 PHONE 806-874-2178

FAYLON WATSON and LAKEY WATSON 
CUSTOM FARMING 

HAY BALING
Terrace Meding and Light Dirt Work 

Cattle Hauling

Yoa do the following to

1.
until the water to aa cold ao It wIK get 

lalng the water faem thia 
; to drink or for cooking. Thla la 

especially important If the water haa 
eet In the plpee

Route I Clarendon, Texas 79226

C O U N TY RO PIN G
June 18th 4:00 p.m. Books close June 16th.
Steer Stopping 4 hd. for $20.00 
Team Roping (Draw Pot) 3 hd. for $40.00 
Draw 4 Partners
Both ropings progessive on one hd.
Breast collar to average winner o f steer stopping.
Handmade spurs to the average winner in the team roping. 
Entries and information at the BOOT SHOP or call 3295 after 7 p.m.

water thru the 
the tap

2. Do not nee hot tap water for 
Hot water 

I water.
Especially avoid using bat tap water 
to make baby formula. If ha

after flashing the tap

3. Make 

ing lead

work in yoa
The City la 

i aa they
lead Joint

Z3-ltc

NOTICE
The Ten  

Services has an 
for an Eligibility

apply*"* {or

N U G G E TTT00
presents

Texas Homebrew  

Live Entertainment 

Saturday June 18th 
9p .m . —1a.m .

Open 7 days a week
_  under new management

The pwUhff requires 4taa n o t « » a a a o a a o s iCT«aan6iBssa 6itKi6« .ttS3 ^ ^  

v e r i f y  and doca- 1988*1989

MISS DONLEY COUNTY PAGEANT
Interviewing, verifying 
mooting case data, completing 
forma,

and 1

OVEREATERS 
ANONYMOUS

I Meets 6:30 Thursday nights I 
Episcopal Church 

Parish House 

301 S. Parks 
No Dues

NoFee“ 5-4tp

HARNED SISTERS FINE ARTS BUILDING 
CLARENDON COLLEGE

Saturday, June 18,1988

7:00 p.m.

Sponsored by Alpha Upsllon Epsilon 
Chapter off Beta Sigma Phi

Admission $2.00
\ N V  N V V V V S X V V S  v

Children Under 5 Free
(StHHOaOBd

4

AND
OFFICE SUPPLIES

. • 0

PRINT SHOPPE
874-2711

Let Us Design Whatever You May Need 

To Your Specifications

★  Wedding Invitations ★L e tte rh e a d s  ★E nve lopes  ★B u s in ess  Cards 

★  Receipt Books ★  Posters ★  Business Forms

ST. STEPHENS BAPTIST CHURCH MARTIN BAPTIST CHURCH
ly Hoggatt, i Paster 

ly  School IOiM i
Charch Service 11:00 ■
Evening Service 6:60 p.m.

Wednesday
Night Service 7:00 p.m.

Rev. Melvin 
Sunday School

Night Service 
Prayer Service

9:451 
11:00 a.m. 
8:30 p.m.
7t30p.m.
8:00 p.m.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

5th A  Jefferaon 
874-3667

Rev. Jamea Carter 
Sunday Scheoi 9:45
Morning Worship 11:00 <

7:60 p.m.
UMY Sunday 6*00p.m.

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
4th A Carhart 

Phil Strand, Minister

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
Minister: Wilbert Bernabe 

Sunday School 9t30
Worship 10:40
Children’s Worship 
Evening Stady 
Yenth

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
CHURCH

Rev. Jerenm A. Campbell 
Montgomery A  Faker St. 

Worship Service# 3:00 p.m.
Wednesday

Nlgf t Services 7:30 p.m.

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
4th A Parka

Rev. Larry Black, Paator 
Sunday Scheoi 9:45
Morning Worship 11:00

PENTECOSTAL HOUNESS CHURCH 
Rev. Clande Pancfa, Pastor 

415 FrAer Street 
Sunday Bible Study 9:45
Worship Service 
Evening Worship 
Wednesday 
Evening Worship

11:00 
6:00 p.m.

Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Evening Worship 

W<
Night Service

9:30 a.m. FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
10:30a.m. Bugbee A 3rd Streets
6*00 p.m. 874-3833

Truman Ledbetter, Pastor 
7*30 p.m. Sunday School 9:451

Morning Worship IltOOi
Training Ualsu 6:00 p.m.

ST. MARY’S CATHOLIC CHURCH I v e a ^  Worship 7:00 p.m.
McClelland A  Montogemery

n v .J . Arnold Carieou FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
Sunday Morning Mass 9:30 a.m. Howard wick

SBC
ASSEMBLY OF GOD Bra. James Martlndale
5th and McCloBand Sunday Scheoi 10:00 a.m.

Rev. J.W. Brawn, Paster Worship Service 11:00a.m.
9:45 a ^ i. Evening Service 6:00 p.m.

11:00 a.m. Wednesday
7*00 p.m- Prayer Meeting 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
Hwy. 287 A Jackson

874-3479
Gary L. Pinion, Peeler 

Sunday Scheoi 
Sunday Worship 
Bible Study 
Evening Worship

Wednesday 
Night Service

10:00 
11 KM 
6:30 p.m. 
740 p.m.

7:30 pan.

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
3rd A Hawley 

874-2321 
Bill Hodges,

Sunday School 
Morning Worship 
Evening Worship

Wednesday 
Night Service

9:45 
11:00 
6:00 p.m.

7 JO p.m.

Beilver’s Service 7:00 p.m. f ir s t  B a p t is t  c h u r c h  h e d l e y
W . Bryan Knowles Pastor

856-5370

BIBLE TRINITY CHAPEL 
Pa

Sunday Service

HEDLEY UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH

James Carter, Paster 
Worship Services 9:30 a.m.
Sunday School 10:30 a.m.
Joint Evening services 4th Sunday 
monthly with Baptist 6:00 p.m.
Wed. Bible Study 7:00 p.m.

ST. JOHN THE BAPTIST 
EPISCOPAL CHURCH 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Holy Communion 11:00 a.m.

HEDLEY CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Bright Newhouse Minister

Sunday School 
Worship Services 
Evening Services 
Wed. Bible Stndy

10:00 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
6:00 p.m. 
7:00 p.m.

Evening
Thursday

Everyone Welcome 
415 Faker Street 

Noe-

9:45 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
740 p.m. 
7:00 p.m.

“ I was glad when they 
said unto me, Let us go 
into  the house o f  the 
Ix>rd.”
Psalm 122:1

Sunday School 
Worship Services 
Evening Services 
Wed. Bible Study

10:00 a.m. 
11:00 a.m. 
6:00 p.m. 
8:00 p.m.

TA TE B A N K

Eads Furniture & Appliances 

Mary’s Country Kitchen

Clarendon Auto Supply

Alderson Chevrolet

Kidds lexaco

I he Clarendon Press

Robertson Funeral Home

The Print Shoppe

Chamber of Commerce 

J & W Lumber

CftamBerCaia
Motor Company

r
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JUNE IS BUSTIN’ OUT ALL OVER -  WITH.,.
I S R H A T  I I I I I I I  B U Y S !
U.S. Choice

CHUCK ROAST CUBED STEAKS 52 ”
D.8. Choice

ARM
Freoh Baby

BEEF LIVER
Wrights Sliced

SLAB BACON
HIRSHEY Kisses A  Miniatures 14 oz. pkg.

Cora Flakes V

POST TOASTIES
Thirst Quencher A ss 't Flavors

GATORADE
Wishbone Ranch or Thousand Island

Ranch Style Nabisco Premium Saitine

BEANS 2 / 7 9 *  CRACKERS

Betty Crocker Layer Assorted

CAKE MIXES
Casserole

PINTO BEANS
S c h i l l i n g s  | h

BLACK PEPPER 91
Duncan Hines Assorted 11 oz. pkg.

H  M  mmmm i.lplon 24 Cllt. box

COOKIES 9 9 c TEABAGS
Breast -o-Chlcken Chunk Light M . can

TUNA 7 9 c
Gladiola White or Yellow

CORNBREAD MIX
4/51

BARBECUE f » Q c
SAUCE 18 oz. bottle -------

1 lb. box

California

CAULIFLOWER 7 9 *
£1 \ Colorado White Russet 10 ib. bag —

I  I POTATOES 8 9 *
California Red Beauty

Jeno Assorted • PLUMS
California

PIZXA 10 oz. pizza

Tvson Garlic, BBQ, Lemon Pepper A  Terlyak

CHICKEN
ORIGINALS

Northern Bathroom

4 roll pkg. 8 9

WISK i  IVORY
Laundry Detergent

$279
Liquid Detergent 
quart bottle

*/i gallon
$ 1

TISSUE
Pnss’n Boots Ass’t Flavors

CAT FOOD 3 / $l°?
ypillmate Jumbo Roll

PAPER TOWELS 7 9 *
$ 139 

$ | 4 9
89

Moppets Kermlt and Miss Piggy 4.3 oz. pump

TOOTHPASTE
White Rain Assorted

16 os. bottleSHAMPOO
kY STARCH 9 9

Faultless

DOUBLE COUPONS 
EVERYDAY

Excluding Cigarette and Tobacco Coupons 
Excluding Free Coupons 
Double Coupons not to exceed item value 
Double Coupons not to exceed *1“

Only One Double Coupon honored on 
multiple purchase of an item

Open Mon. ■ Sot. 7 a.m. -7 p
Nome Owned and Operated by Jack and Shirlny Clifford

•74-2425 Clarondon

STORE
Closed Sunday t q O°


