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Analysis Of Amendments
*  *  m m m m *  *  *

Texas residents will be going 
to the polls August 5. 1969 to de­
cide the fate of nine Constitu­
tional Amendments. Because our 
Constitution is the instrument 
guaranteeing our liberties and 
since it is not simple or easy to 
revise it, citizens have a great 
responsibility in voting to adopt 
or reject proposals such as the 
ninp which are being separately 
analyzed this week and next in 
the Donlpy County Leader.

You, our readers, are asked to 
study, read as much as you can 
find in regards to these propos­
als, give each and every one 
your serious consideration and 
thought and by all means, GO 
VOTE.

The public is constantly being 
bombarded with proponents for 
and those against these amend­
ments. This office receives daily 
a stack of mail stressing the pros 
and eons of each tending to add 
confusion to our thinking. All the 
more reason for studying and 
thinking as we prepare to VOTE 

The text of the Amendments 
follows with pros and cons: 

AMENDMENT NO. 1 — The 
constitutional amendment to re­
peal the obsolete, superfluous 
and unnecessary sections of the 
Constitution.

The proposed amendment re­
peals those sections of the Tex­
as Constitution which after care­
ful study, have been determined 
to be obsolete and unnecessary. 
Certain specific sections are 
named such a the section auth 
orizing the Legislature to make 
appropriations for support and 
maintenance of the Texas Cen-

I
tennial adopted in the fall of 
19.12. or thw section allowing 
three million acres of public do­
main to be appropriated and set 
apart for the purpose of erecting 
the State Capitol. The amend­
ment also provides that repeals 
be made with the understanding 
that the repeal shall in no way 
make any substantial changes in 
the present constitution, covering 
obsolescence due to exhaustion 
of subject matter, pursuant to 
provision, provisions in conflict

I
 with the U. S. Constitution and 
unnecessary police power pro­
visions. This is said to be a 
clean-up measure.

However, it has long been 
argued that our constitution is 

outdated and that we need an en­
tire ly  new constitution written.
this the placing of the foot in 

it  he door, so to speak, to bring 
'th is about?

AMENDMENT NO. 2 — Would 
grant the powers and flexibility 
of operation to the Texas Water 
Development Board necessary 
to develop sufficient water re­
sources for present and future 
Economic development of the 
state. Specifically it broadens 
the powers of the Water Develop­
ment Board, increases the con­
stitutionally authorized amount 
of Water Development Bonds by 
an additional {3.5 billion subject 
to approval of two-thirds major­
ity of the legislature, eliminates 
tljr present 4 percent interest 
rate ceiling on Water Develop­
ment Bonds, eliminates the 1982 

termination date for the WD 
F'tsnd derived from the sale of 

Bonds, extends the maturity 
edules for WD Bonds from 40 

150 years, and authorizes the 
kns WD Board under certain 
renditions to receive grants and 
to|contraet with the U. S., other 
stgtes, foreign governments and 
others for acquisition and de- 
veiopment of water resources 
and facilities.

Opposition seems to come from 
the broad sweep of the State Wa­

ter Plan and questions about 
some of its specific provisions, 

are afraid they will lose 
water rights under this 
Some are afraid that 

which will be brought to 
area will not be distributed 

and some say they are 
hesitant because of the 

sums of money involved.
NO. 3 — would 
the legislature to set 

Jary of the lieutenant gov- 
and the speaker of the

- tire

t

house of representatives at not 
more than one-half the salary of 
the governor and to set the sal­
ary of other members of the leg­
islature at not more than the 
salary of a district judge.

In support of this amendment 
it is felt that legislators can no 
longer be considered part-time 
officials. Each time a pay rnise 
is needed it requires a popular 
vote, calling a special election 
and the cost thereof. Too, the 
present limitation to a 120 day 
peroid for payment of {12 per 
day allowance while the expen­
ses continue throughout the full 
140 day session places a hard­
ship on legislators.

Against this measure is the 
argument that since the salary 
of the governor or a district 
judge may be increased at any 
time by the legislature, the re­
moval of the dollar ceiling on 
the presiding officers’ and mem­
bers’ salaries would make any 
salary possible. A substantial 
pav increase and a longer per­
iod during which the per day al­
lowance would be paid would 
add further to the expenses of 
government. Further, a maxi­
mum legislative salary equal to 
that of a district judge who 
works the year round is exces­
sive for what might be termed a 
part-time job, and is in many 
cases excessive of the full-time 
salary drawn by the average 
Texan.

AMENDMENT NO. 4 — pro­
vides for exempting nonprofit 
water supply corporations from 
ad valorem taxes. For this a- 
mendment, arguments are that 
nonprofit water supply corpora­
tions perform a vital function for 
many parts of the state that 
would not otherwise have ade­
quate water supplies and would 
thus encourage the formation of 
corporations and the develop­
ment of water resources. These 
Corporations to be exempted are 
nonprofit and perform a govern­
mental function.

Against this amendment argu­
ments are that there are ms 
privately owned water sup] 
corporations which are run 
profit. With rising costs of gi 
emment and the difficulty 
finding sources of revenue, a 
reduction in the present tax bf 
is unwise.

AMENDMENT NO. 5 — P 
vides for the increase in I 
maximum (most) amount whi 
may be paid in one year frt 
state funds for public assistar 
payments to needy aged, nee 
disabled, needy blind, and nee 
children to {80 million, and s 
propriating {15 million for ea 
of the next two fiscal years 1 
ginning Sept. 1, 1969 in additi 
to the amounts appropriated 1 
these purposes in the regular A 
propriation Act for the fisc 
year beginning September 
1969.

For this Amendment is the fa 
provision would be made to i 
low the legislature to appropria 
.sufficient funds to again enat 
the State Department of Publ 
Welfare to make assistance pa 
ments to all four classes of w< 
fare recipients in aeeordan 
with the minimal standards 
need established by the depai 
rnent. Texas has consistent 
been among the lowest of ti 
states in terms of average p 
capita monthly assistance. TI 
State Department of Public W« 
fare now is able to pay only I 
percent of what it says should I 
provided for needy children ai 

is powerless to restore ben 
fit payments to the levels reeo 
nized as minimal unless th 
Amendment is adopted.

Against this Amendment is ti 
consideration of the large ovd 
all expenditure of state fun< 
which would be authorized ar 
yet would increase the incon 
of those on the rolls only a fe 
dollars each month at a tin 
when the state la alroady hai 
pressed to meet existing finan­
cial obligations. It is further 
argued that welfare rolls con­
tinue to grow and as they grow, 

(See Amendments Page 8)

Ex-Students Of 
McKnight Meet In
Amarillo Park

Sunday, July 20, 1969, nt
Thompson Park in Amarillo ap­
proximately 65 ex-students and 
their families gathered for the 
annual picnic for ex-st udrnts and 
residents of the McKnight com' 
munity,

A bountiful lunch from well- 
filled picnic baskets was enjoyed 
at the noon hour and the after­
noon was pleasantly spent in 
fond reminiscing, looking at old 
photos brought by various guests, 
and taking new photos.

Attending the reunion were 
three pupils from the first Mc­
Knight school which was held in 
1907. These were W. T. Hardy 
and Loyd Mormon of Tulia, Tex­
as and Jim Crawford of Amar­
illo. Two ex-teachers were pres­
ent: Mrs. Newman Bartley
(Winnie Spears) of Tahoka, Tex­
as and Mrs. Slats DeBord (Peg­
gy Rogers) of Hedley, Texas.

During the business session, 
Mrs. I. M. Caldwell of Amarillo 
was elected president for the 
coming year. Mrs. E. O. Dish- 
man was elected secretary- 
treasurer. Mr. and Mrs. Jerrold 
Read of Amarillo are the official 
hosts ns they have so graciously 
been for several years.

As the day ended and as the 
many farewells were made, 
plans were underway for a still 
larger gathering in 1970.

McANEAR REPORTS TO 
MARYLAND BASE

Dwight McAnear and his wife 
have gone to Salisaw, Okla. 
where they will v isit, with her 
people before leaving for Fort 
Meade, Maryland where Dwight 
will report for duty with the U. 
S. Army Hospital unit there. 
They have visited the past sev­
eral days with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. G. McAnear and 
other re! .lives while on a 14-day 
leave.

Dwight has just completed his 
basic training at Ft. Bliss, El

NATIONAL FARM 
SAFFTY WEEK 

JULY 20-26,1969

ALDERSON TO SERVE ON 
AUTO DEALERS ASS N

Gene Alderson, owner of the 
Alderson Chevrolet in Clarendon, 
has been appointed to the key 
post of Area Director of the Tex­
as Automobile Dealers Associa­
tion. In this capacity Alderson 
will report to the TADA Board 
of Directors on all phases of ac­
tivity relating to the motor ve­
hicle buying public in the Claren­
don area.

Mr. Alderson will also work 
closely with legislative and other 
governmental officials on all 
matters pertaining to the indus­
try and the auto buying public.

L W DABNEY SERVICES 
HELD AT CLAUDE

Last rites in memory of Lester 
Williams Dabney, 63, a former 
Goodnight resident, were held 
Tuesday afternoon in the Claude 
Church of Christ with James Bry­
ant, minister, officiating. Burial 
was in Memorial Park Cemetery 
in Amarillo.

Mr. Dabney died Saturday in 
Groom Memorial Hospital.

Survivors include his wife; four 
sons, one of which is Ricky of 
Goodnight; two stepsons; a 
daughter, his parents, a brother, 
and a sister.

Greenbugs Infest 
Sorghum Fields

Greenbug infestations in grain 
sorghum are increasing In many 
fields in Donley County, accord­
ing to County Agent Ronald 
Gooch. Farmers are encouraged 
to inspect their fields frequently 
to detect any damage from the 
tiny green pests.

The greenbugs are being found 
mainly on the underside of the 
lower leaves with some redden­
ing showing as a symptom of 
damage.

Entomologists give these guide­
lines for determining the need 
for treating the greenbugs. Treat 
plants from emergence to about 
six inches high when greenbugs 
and damage are visible on the 
leaf surface. Treat plants from 
about the six-inch height to the 
pre-boot stage before any entire
leaves are killed. Treat
ihnt are  in the pre-boot stage and 
larger when there is a large 
enough greenbug infestation to 
cause death to more than the 
two lower normal-sized leaves.

Additional information on 
greenbugs and insecticides rec­
ommended for controlling them 
is available at the County Agent’s 
office.

LEADER CLASSIFIEDS

Farm News
from County ASCS Com.

Measurement Service
If you do not wish to measure 

and determine your own acreage 
you can reque st a measurement 
service. The cost of this service 
is {8.50 per farm plus {3.00 for 
each plot over one . You musl 
moke your request early enough 
to allow time for us to measure 
and compute thf acreages be­
fore August 15, 1969.
Acreage Reports

Don’t forget August 15, 1969!! 
This is the last day to report 
your crop and diverted acreages. 
To date, about one-third of the 
producers have turned in their 
reports. There are over 450 
farms whioh have not been cer­
tified and only three weeks re­
main before the deadline. You 
are encouraged to make your 
report as soon as possible.

It is very important that the 
acreage be determined correctly. 
Fiftopn percent of the feed grain 
and fifteen percent of the rolton 
farms will he selected nt random 
to be spot-checked. If the mea­
sured acres differ by more than 
the applicable variation from the 
reported acres—producers could 
lose all payments on all farms. 
Thus, we urge you to be very 
careful when measuring your 
crops.
Cotton Loans

Producers who placed 1968 cot­
ton under CCC loans are remind­
ed that July 31, 1969, is the 
maturity date. Any cotton not re­
deemed by this date will auto­
matically be forfeitel to CCC.

Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Rose of 
Clarksville, Mr. and Mrs. Rusty
Scott and daughters of Guymon, 
and Mr. and Mrs. H. R. King 
and Steve of Amarillo were 
week end guests in the home of 
Mrs. Wilma Batson and Mack.

Mrs. G. W. Estlack visited 
Friday morning with Mrs. Nettie 
Curry at Palo Duro Convalescent

Hartwell Services At 
Hedley Tuesday

Funeral services for Herbert 
Grant Hartwell, 67, of Hedley 
were held Tuesday morning in 
the Hedley Churrh of Christ with 
Robert Howard, minister of the 
Hedley Church of Christ officiat­
ing. Burial was in Rowe Ceme­
tery.

Mr. Hartwell died Sunday 
morning in Hall County Hospital 
following a heart attack. He was 
horn in Ivanhoe and was a re­
tired farmer.

Surviving are his wife, Nora 
Jan of Hedley; sons, Lee Roy 
and James of Amarillo: a daugh­
ter, Mrs. Philip Cobb of Pampa; 
brothers, Nathan of San Luis 
Obispo. Calif., Joe of Sacramen­
to, Calif., and L. D. of Pasco, 
Wash.; sisters, Mrs. Arthur 
Barnes and Mrs. Mildred Hen- 
shaw, both of Pampa, and Mrs. 
Thurman Fletcher of Mangum, 
Okla.; four grandchildren and 
five great-grandchildren.

RATTAN PURCHASES 
LEGION BUILDING

Announcement is being made 
in the Leader this week of the 
purchase of the Legion huilding 
by Dennis Rattan.

Rattan Television Service and 
Cable TV of Clarendon were 
moved to the new location last 
week end. The front portion of 
the building was remodeled to 
accomodate the business.

A separate door and hallway 
has been provided for access to 
the auditorium area of the 
huilding for public gatherings 
etc.

Safety Hasn’t Kept 
Pace On Farm,
President Notes

HOSPITAL NOTES

Patients as of Wed., July 23— 
Herbert Allred, Frank Thomas 
Henry Griggs, Roy Brock, Mrs, 

B. Estes, Bill Todd, and Char 
lie Swinney.

Dismissals — W. J. Adams, 
Floyd Brewer, John Clendennen,

President Nixon, in signing a 
proclamation designating July 
20-26 as Farm Sufety Week, 
noted that although American 
agriculture has made great 
strides in production it never­
theless remains the nation's 
third most hazardous industry.

Mr. Nixon stated that ‘‘the 
strong hands and management 
skills of our farm people have 
dramatically increased farm 
production,” and observed that 
“American agriculture has ad­
vanced more in the past 50 
years than in all prior history.” 

“A third as many farmers,” 
Mr. Nixon noted, “are feeding 
twice as many Americans today 
as in 1920.

“ In addition, America is the 
world's largest exporter of ag­
ricultural products, and our 
abundance is a powerful force 
for world peace.”

While their accomplishments 
have dramatically increased 
production, Mr. Nixon said, “our 
farm people have suffered a 
tragic toil of accidents.”

The President emphasized that 
agriculture continues to rank 
third among American indus­
tries in accidental death rate.

“Thousands of farm resi­
dents,” Mr. Nixon said, “are 
fatally injured every year and 
hundreds of thousands dis­
abled. The dollar cost to the 
nation approaches {2 billion, but 
the cost in pain, grief and suf­
fering cannot be measured.” 

“This terrible waste demands 
our urgent attention,” Mr. Nixon 
said. ‘I t  can be sharply reduced 
if everyone working in agricul­
ture makes satety an integral 
part of management planning, 
a part of every job and every 
activity, both on and off the 
job.”

Mr. Nixon called on all farm 
families, and those persons and 
groups serving or allied with ag­
riculture, to use all possible 
means for minimizing accident 
losses at work, in homes, at 
recreation, and on public roads.

TWO LUBBOCK YOUTH 
INJURED IN AUTO 
TRAIN CRASH

Two Lubbock youth were in­
jured at one o’clock Wednesday 
afternoon when the pickup they 
were riding in was struck by a 
west-bound freight train at the 
first crossing east of the local 
depot.

The two youth, Donald Todd, 19 
and Norman Massey, 12, were 
receiving emergency treatment 
at Adair Hospital at press time. 
The boys were helping young 
Massey’s father, Marvin Massey, 
on construction work at the Leo 
Snoddy home just north of the 
accident site. He rushed over to 
assist them when he heard the 
crash. Todd is a nephew of Mas­
sey. All are from Lubbock.

The pickup was totally de­
molished with parts of the ve­
hicle scattered for several hun­
dred feet. M. C. Allen of Amar­
illo was the train engineer.

GRANDSON DIES IN 
DUMAS SATURDAY

Astronauts Neil Armstrong (left) and Edwin E. Aldrin Jr. (right) hooked up with the Command Module Columbia, piloted by Michael 
Collins (center), and the return to Earth Monday afternoon after they had completed the first exploration of the moon surface by man Sun­
day, July 20, 1969. They are scheduled to splash down in the Pacific Ocean southwest of Hawaii at 12:51 today, Thursday, July 24.

David George Mixon, 16, 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. C. L. 
Mixon of Clarendon, died Satur­
day in Dumas Memorial Hospital 
after a lengthy illness. Funeral 
services and burial were held 
Monday afternoon at the First 
Baptist Church in Dumas with 
Rev. Edward Rogers, pastor, of­
ficiating. Burial was in North- 
lawn Memorial Gardens.

Young Mixon was the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Mixon and 
wa» the Panhandle Chapter Pos­
ter Boy in the 1964 Muscular 
Dystrophy Association of Ameri­
ca.

Survivors include his parents, a 
sister, and the grandparents of 
Clarendon.

Mrs. Hugh Prottt of Ardmore, 
Okla. visited her aunt. Mrs. Ho­
mer Mulkey, enroute to Colorado 
this last week.
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ASHTOLA NEWS
Mrs. Hubert Rhoades

Mrs. H. S. Mahaffry visited 
Tuesday in Memphis with Mrs. 
George Frost.

Mrs. Ruth Thornton of Phoe­
nix, Arizona arrived Tuesday lor 
an extended visit with (he Gra­
hams and Rhoades families.

Mrs. OUk Nelson and Mrs. 
Ella Biggs of Dallas came in 
Wernesday. Mrs. Biggs will stay 
tor a visit.

Mrs. Lena Mae Graham re­
turned Wednesday for a visit in 
Vernon with her mother, Mrs. 
Nunn Sutton. Mrs. Sutton is doing 
very well.

Mrs. Ruth Thornton and Mrs. 
Hubert Rhoades spent Friday in 
Eatelline with Mrs. Gussie Moth- 
erslwxl.

Mrs. R. R. Partain visited 
Tuesday morning with Mrs. NIl­
ford Dill

Mrs. Jerome Doerrie of Book­
er, Okla. came Monday night. 
BHh and Elian returned home 
with her alter a visit ,in ^xikcr.

Mrs. Leon Foster visited her 
mother, Mrs. Davie Meador, in 
Hedley Tuesday.

Mrs. Lena Mae Graham went 
to Dodson Thursday. Mrs. Has- 
kel Talley and children returned 
home with her for a visit.

Mrs. Gladys Gresham spent 
several days in Groom with the 
Laymon Hightower family.

Mrs. Ruth Thornton and Mrs. 
Hubert Rhoades visited Friday 
afternoon with Mrs. W. A. Poo- 
vey and had supper with Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyce Graham and Mike.

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Nelson and 
daughter of Dumas visited a 
while Friday evening with Mr. 
and Mrs. T. A. Nelson. They 
were starting east on a vacation.

Mrs. Betty White and boys of 
Amarillo came Friday to visit 
Mrs. Lena Mae Graham. The 
boys stayed for a longer visit.

Mrs. Dora Joyner of Amarillo 
spent the week end with Mrs. CH- 
lie Nelson and Mrs. Ella Biggs.

Wednesday Mrs. Gordon Stoll- 
fus and children o f Denver, 
Colo., enroute to their home in 
Fort Worth, stopped lor a visit 
Wth the Nufurd Dills.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Ward of 
Memphis visitel Friday night 
with Mr. and Mrs. J. R Graham. 

Mrs. May Naylor, Joaa and
Mrs. Taylor of Crowell, Texas 
visited the Horace Greens and 
Jana stayed lor a longer visit. 

Tony Wallace at Clarendon
spent Tuesday and Wednesday
with the Van Knox.

Tluise having lunch with the 
Hubert Rhoades and Mrs. Ruth 
Thornton Saturday were Mr. and
Mrs. J. R. Graham, Mrs. Hasted 
Talley and children of Dodson, 
and Bobby and Gary White of 
Amarillo.

Rudy Partain of Denton spent 
the week end with the R. R. Par-
tains,

Mr. and Mrs. H. S. Mahaffey 
spent the week end with the R.
R. Partains.

Mr. and Mrs. H. S. Mahaffey 
spent Friday and Saturday in 
Levelland Retting acquainted 
with their great grandson, James 
Dane Todd. The parents are 
James and Winnona Todd. 
Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Dane Perdue, all of Levelland. 
Die little fellow weighed 6 lbs 
10 oz.

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Graham at- 
tt nded the Richie-Sarpalhis 
wedding at Boys Ranch Saturday 
afternoon.

Mrs. Ben Lovell visited Thurs­
day morning with Mrs. Nulord 
Dill.

Mrs. Horace Green and Mrs. 
Doerrie made a business trip to 
Amarillo Tuesday.

Lowell Hall of Goodnight filled
the pulpit at the church in Bur­
ger Sunday and Bro. Moore 
preached in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Doss Finley vis­
ited Friday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Eamie Collie.

Mrs. Ethel Reid visited Satur­
day morning with Mrs. Nuford 
Dill.

Mrs, Lowell Hall and children 
of Goodnight and Bill Jordan of 
Clarendon had Sunday dinner 
with Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Lane. 
|M r .  and Mrs. Leon Foster vis­
ited Saturday with the Othel 
Elliotts.

Mr. and Mrs. W. P. Finley 
spent Sunday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Doss Finley. They were re­
turning to their home lo Clarks­
ville alter a vacation trip in 
Mexico. r , g  :

WE WISH TO

Announce
TO OUR FRIENDS AND CUSTOMERS

We have purchased the building known as the Leprion 

Hall, remodeled the front portion and have

Moved
TO THIS NEW LOCATION

We invite you to visit us here where you can transact 

your business in more comfortable and nicer accomo* 

dations.

Rattan TV Service 
Cable Television

OF CLARENDON 

Phone 874-3570
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Roddy's Plumbing 
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HENSON’S
Your Goodyear Store 

CLARENDON, TEXAS

Mrs, Laymon Hightower was 
released from Groom Hospital

Mr. and Mrs Robin Green and 
Mori of Lubbock spent Saturday 
with the Horace Greens.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul White of 
Fritch and Mr. and Mrs. Leon 
Foster visited Saturday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. Nuford DiU.

Mrs. Horace Green and Mr*- 
Jerome Doerrie made a business 
trip to Pampa Thursday.

Mrs. Lena Mae Graham and 
Mrs- Hasltel Talley visited Sun­
day morning with Mr. apd Mrs 
Leon Foster.

Mr. and Mrs. Chet Roefir wept 
to Samnorwood Sunday after­
noon from a visit with Mr. and 
Mrs. Dick Roel\r.

Mrs. Layman Hightower anl 
children of Groom spent Sunday 
with Mr. and Mrs. George Gres­
ham.

Bro. Moore of Borg^r"'spent 
Sunday night with Mr. anl Mrs
J. B. I-ane.

Mr.'khrf Mrs.*}; tt^fcYa^arn at­
tended the Cornel 1-Waldrop wfd 
ding Saturday night. ' ' ‘ '4 -

Mrs. Bilik Jean Moore of Can­
yon attended the Ritchle-8arpa 
lius wedding at Roys Ranch and 
the Comell-Waldrop wedding In 
Clarendon and visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. Van Knox before re­
turning to Canyon.

The Moffett families enjoyed 
a reunion at Ashtola Community 
Center Saturday and Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Wade of 
Oklahoma City visited Saturday 
with the Leon Fosters.

Mrs. Jerome Doerrie returned 
to Booker, Okla. Sunday.

HEDLEY NEWS
Mrs. Mabel Bridges

week i

Mrs. Fay Howell of Texline re­
turned home Tuesday after vis­
iting her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Tate.

Mr. and Mrs. Tige Hill are 
moving to Sunset, Texas. They 
are there getting their new home 
ready.

Mrs. Gladys Johnson spent 
Wednesday in Pampa with her 
daughter, Mrs. Velma Gibaon 
who underwent surgery.

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Stafford 
boys of Abilene spent the week 
with the Jack Staffords. J 

H. G. Hartwell was rushed to 
Hall County Hospital early 
Thursday morning with a severe 
heart attack.

Ed Floyd had the misfortune 
to receive a broken leg when a 
roll of wire fell on him Wednes­
day morning.

James and Le Roy Hartwell of 
Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. Philip 
Cobb and children, Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Barnes and Mrs. Mildreif 
Crenshaw of Pampa were here 
Thursday due to the serious ill­
ness of their father and brother, 
H. G. Hartwell.

Mike Chesser returned Mon­
day night tor duty in the U.S. 
Navy after viaitnig his father, 
Jim Chesser, who is ill in Vet-

YOUft BEST BUY)

erans Hospital in Amarillo.
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Brumley 

are in Dallas where Jack i« re­
ceiving medical care

Visiting last week in the Tom 
Tate home were their grand­
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Cox and children nf Farweil. and 
Mr. and Mrs. Bin Carson and 
children of Borger.

Mrs. Alfred Spalding. Mrs. W. 
B. Meeks, and Miss Jessie Davis 
were able to come home Tues­
day from Hall County Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim  Younger and 
bafciy of Plqinvifw spent the first 
of the week with his mother. 
Mrs. Sam Younger.

Mrs. Frost is a patient in Hall 
County Hospital.

Mrs. Betty Hoggatt left Amar­
illo by plane Wednesday morn­
ing for Houston for a checkup at 
M. D. Anderson Clinic. Wc are 
happy to learn she got a good 
report and returned home Wed­
nesday night.

Jean Floyd was able to come 
home 'hum ’" hospital
Frklhy: His father, Ed, was able 
to M ii5> home after Retting a 
cast on his leg and is convalesc­
ing at ft&me.

Mr. J4rtd Mrs. Lovelady and 
daughter of Phoenix, Arizona 
are visiting the lady’r-parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Elmp, Kennedy and
sister, Mrs. Bud - Hoggatt and 
family.

Recent visitors in the home of 
Mrs. Ethel Kinslow were her
sister-in-law, Mrs. O. J . Whit­
tington of Long Beach, Calif., 
and the Bert Whittington family 
of Hereford.

Mrs. W. A. Pierce and Mrs. 
Lola Brown spent the week end 
in Panhandle with the Fred Car­
ters.

Mr. and Mrs. Wyman Holland 
and daughter vacationed in Den­
ver and Yellowstone Park last 
we4k.

Friends extend deepest sym­
pathy to the Hartwell family in 
the death of Mr. Hartwell who 
died Sunday morning at Hall 
County Hospital. Funeral serv­
ices were held at the Hedley 
Church of Christ Tuesday morn­
ing with burial in Rowe Ceme­
tery.

Mrs. Mildred Shaw and Randy 
spent the week end with Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Shaw at Coyanosa.

Harry Boatright visited his 
son, Harry Boatright Jr., and 
famjlj/ in Oklahoma the past 
week end.

The Hedley Post of the Ameri­
can Legion has started the drive 
for 1870 memberships. Twenty 
members have already paid their 
dues in advance. Quota will prob­
ably be 100 or more.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Clifford 
Johnson and Ricky ol Corpus 
Christ! are visiting the Clifford 
Johnsons this week.

If is nice to have Mr. and Mrs. 
L. E. Bogue back at home at 
the Hotel. Both have been in and 
out of hospitals for tha past 
three weeks. i<

The first place trophy won by 
the Hedley Lions Culb in Claren­
don's July 4th parade is on dis­
play at Stafford Grocery.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Steele 
of Childress visited Mr. and Mrs. 
L. E. Bogue Saturday of last 
week.

with our money and our influ­
ence and the ones wc still have.

A true friend is one to whom 
we can tell the truth and not be 
afraid ol Item laughing at us. < 
We should be able to admit the 
bad in our Ufa and still feel that 
they would lqve us . . .

A nation should try to mike 
friends . . . They can be more 
helpful and valuable than bat­
tleships. We have too long tried 
to influence the world with our 
money and influence as a nation. 
We wind up bidding against the 
Cbmmunist for many of the na­
tions’ friendship. They probably 
don't think much more of the 
one who makes the top bid.

CREEPING MESQUITE CON. 
TROL — The bast known meth­
od for controlling creeping mes- 
quite far range restoration is 
with repeated yeai4y aerial ap­
plication of 2,4,5-T says G. O. 
Hoffman, Extension range brush 
and weed specialist. Recent tests 
showed that four yearly treat­
ments controlled 98 per cent of 
the infestation and domestic- 
livestock grazing was increased 
by 24 per cent. Hoffman’s recom­
mendation calls for 0.67 of a 
pound of 2,-Lo-T low volatile 
ester mixed in 1 gallon of diesel 
oU and water for a total of 5 
gallons of solution per acre.

Conservation is everybody's 
business.

The Vions ..dub Disfrift, Cabi­
net will meet at the Holiday Inn 
West In Amarillo this Saturday 
and Sunday. Local Lions arc In­
vited to attend whether members 
of the Cabinet or not. There will 
be special entertainment for the 
ladies.

The Hedley Lions Club win 
hold its annual family picnic 
Thursday night of next week. It 
will 6e a chicken barbecue at the 
City Park in Hedley,

FLOWERS AND FRIENDS
God made the flowers beautiful.

Some red, some white, or blue. | 
God also made for us dear 

friends
With hearts so kind and true.

He placed one here another 
there,

Wc see them every day.
Each help smooth out life’s 

rougher spots 
And brighten up our way.

Flowers are beauty to the eyes 
Kind friends food for the heart. 

And both can be so wonderful 
As each one plays its part.

CCW

Friendship like soap rubs off 
easily, and leaves us with a 
brighter look.

The with which we give
the gift can mean more to a 
friend than the gift itself.

We need to build our fences 
low enough so that wc can shake 
hands over them.

Yoji can’t spell Brothers with­
out spelling Others.

There Is said to be two kinds 
of friends; the ones we bought

O now ont /In n iH on fp

It’s Better to Be
Safe than Sorry

Insure against costly farm accidents 
by being careful. Practice the habit 
of safety every day.
Come by and see us for Farmers 
Comprehensive Personal Liability 
Coverage.

knorppI nsurance
AGENCY
Walt Knorpp

G O O D - Y E A R

ELECTRIC
WATER HEATER

H IR ES
WHYI

NO PIUS. PITS ANYWHBB 

NO PHOT, NO PIAMB 

CLEAN, ODORLESS 

QUICK RECOVERY!

PULL 10 YEAR GUARANTEE!

FREE W IRING

your best tire buy in itsprice range...
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LELIA LAKE 

NEWS
Mi-s. Pauline Roberts

Mr. and Mrs. Austin Aten and 
grandson Billy Brothers of San 
Angelo arrived Friday to spend 
the weekend with his brothers, 
Mr. and Mrs. L. D. Aten and Mr. 
and Mrs. Quinn Aten.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Rous­
seau of Tulia visited Mr. and 
Mrs. F. B. Butler Sunday.

Mrs. J. L. Butler was in Amar­
illo Friday to meet her cousins, 
Mrs. Lorraine Patterson and 
Mrs. Suzanne Stepp of Clarks­
ville, Tonn. They will be here 
several days.

Mr. and Mrs. L. L. Rose of 
Clarksville visited Friday with 
cousins, Mr. and Mrs. D. M. 
Cook.

Mr. and Mrs. Cicero Turpin of 
McLean spent Sunday with her

parents, Mr. and Mrs. L. R.
Foster.

Dr. Keith Reed of Salt Lake 
City, Utah arrived Saturday to 
be with Mrs. Reed. Karen and 
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Dlshman.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Britten 
and fnmlly of Amarillo spent the 
weekend with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. E. E. Fox.

Mr. and Mrs. L. C. Myers, 
Jimmie and Danny White of 
Amarillo visited Saturday with 
E. R. Myers anl Glfnn.

Mrs. Oneta Munger and Jeff of 
Fritch visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. E. D. Head Monday.

Mrs. F. A. Floyd, Mrs. Mollie 
Moffitt and Mary Lynn of Mem­
phis, and Mrs. Willard Knox 
shopp'd in Amarillo Saturday.

Mr. und Mrs. Ted Swindel and 
Stephanie of Hereford spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. C. 
C. Ayers Larry anl Wayne. Ste­
phanie remained for a longer 
visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Messer and 
boys and a nephew of Iledley 
visited Sunday with Mr,; and

HOMEN MEAT CO.
CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING & PROCESSING

Country Ham, Bacon, Sausage
“ >... . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6 5 c

GRAIN FED BEEF
Prices Below Include Processing

Half .............  Lb.

Front Quarter .. Lb. 5 3 '  

Hind Quarter .. Lb. 6 9 «
Slaughtering of Cattle & Hogs Any Week Day 

Phone 874-2154 — Box 389 — Clarendon 
JOHN BROOKS, MANAGER

Mrs. Arthur Shields and boys.
Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Butler en­

tertained Sunday with a Barbe­
cue honoring her visiting rela­
tives, Mrs. Lorraine Patterson 
and Mrs. Suzanne Stepp of 
Clarksville, Tonn, Those present 
were Mr. and Mrs. B. M. Ro­
berts, Mrs. J. H. Roberts and 
Mrs. Carrie Ballcw of Amarillo, 
Mr. and Mrs. Andrew Womack, 
Memphis anl Mr. and Mrs. O. D. 
Roberts.

Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Shields 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Buster 
Shields and family of Stinnett 
and Mr. and Mrs. A. K. King 
and family of Fritch. Denny 
King returned home with them.

Mr. and Mrs. O. L. Usrey has 
two granddaughters visiting them 
this week. They are Marsha and 
Sue Riffle of Little Rock, Ark.

Mr. and Mrs. J. J  . Asher, 
June and Bobby returned Wed­
nesday from an extended trip 
which took them to Iowa and 
northern Minnesota. They for­
merly lived in St. Paul, Minn.

Mikr and Jim Nichols of Am­
arillo are visiting the Dean Peo­
ple* family.

Those visiting Mrs. Cap Ander­
son during the weekend were 
Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Pierce of 
Grand Prairie, Mrs. M. B. 
Rhoades of Vernon, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Gouge and children, 
Memphis and Mr. and Mrs. J. B. 
McDaniel.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Altman and 
girls attended a wedding which 
was held Saturday at Boys 
Ranch.

Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Shields arid 
Mr. and Mrs. George Shields 
were In Amarillo Tuesday nignt.

Mrs. J. L. Butler, Mrs. Lor­
raine Patterson and Mrs. Su­
zanne Stepp spent Monday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Womack 
in Memphis.

Those visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
E. E. Fox during the week were 
Mrs. Bertha Gemer of Amarillo, 
Mrs. Alma Gemer of Clarendon, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Phaneuf and 
girls of Phoenix, Ariz., Mr. and 
Mrs. McQuer of Esteliine, Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo Snoddy of Claren­
don, Mrs. Myrtle Rhoades of Ver­
non, Mr. and Mrs. H. C. Swank 
of Groom, Larry Mooring of Am­
arillo and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Wayne Stepp of Clarendon.

and son and enjoyed coffee with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Hardin.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Dingier 
visited their daughter, Mrs. Gene 
Grimlund and girls of Amarillo 
in the home of another daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Warren Hardin and 
Paula.

Range grasses were planted on 
over 200,000 acres of land last 
year in Texas by conservation 
district cooperators. This im­
proves cover and reduces soil 
and water loss.

DO m u K N O W ,

SHOCK TREATMENT — Jeep-mounted radio equipment gets the “once over” from 
tm airborne rigging specialist during the air transportability phase of a service test 
pond acted at Fort Bragg, N.C, by the Airborne, Electronics and Special Warfare 
Hoard. The hoard in an activity of the U.S. Army Test and has Evaluation Command, 

i at the teet in to determine what effects air transDort has on radio equipment.

CHAMBERLAIN

NEWS
Mrs. A. O. Hott

Pete and Jake Cbrbin, Mrs. 
Berta Faye Templpfon, and Cur­
tis Worth, all of Amarillo spent 
Sunday with their sisters, Misses 
Ruth and Nell Corbin.

Mrs. Frank Thomason anl her 
daughter, Mrs. Carol Duncan, 
Gary and Tanya of Greeley, 
Cblo. visited Mr. and Mrs. A. L. 
Duncan in Wellington Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. D. R. Lindley 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Leo Snod­
dy in Clarendon Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Pickering 
and children of Granbury spent 
a few days and Mr. anl Mrs. 
Marion Stone and children, Mrs. 
Helen Anderson and Jana, Lloyd 
Lee and their mother, Mrs. Lil­
lie Stone, all of Plalnview were 
guests Sunday in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Henry Hastey.

Mrs. Jess Ivey is on the sick 
list.

Those who visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Jess Ivey were his brother, 
Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Ivey, Mrs. 
Morris Crump and Ray and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ivey’s grandson, John 
Hatfield of Dalian.

Mrs. W. E. Dolman, Ronnld 
Ray and Deborah of Odessa 
spent the week end with their 
parents and grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. H. A. Harrison. The 
children will stay for a longer 
visit with their grandparents and 
their uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Dennis 
Harrison and Anna.
^Mr. and Mrs. Henry Minn and 

their daughters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Garth Carter and family of Du­
mas and Mr. and Mrs. Gurvis 
Kcnnard and Jennifer of Amnril- 
lo gave another daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Abe Turner and child­
ren of Haskell a family surprise 
over the weekend. Mr. and Mrs. 
Mann and Mr. and Mrs. Kennard 
returned by Lakeview and vis­
ited Gurvis’s grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. M. M. Kennard.

Mrs, R. W. Moore and Rex of 
Amarillo and her sister, Winnie 
of El Paso, visited Mr. and Mrs. 
H. A. Harrison Sunday morning.

Mr. and Mrs. Theron Holland 
and children of Clarendon vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Har­
rison and Anna Sunday after­
noon.

Mrs. Jewell Carter of Gaines­
ville and her nioce, Mrs. Larry 
Scroggins and son, Brad, of Den­
ton visited her sister and brother- 
in-law, Mr. nnd Mrs. D. G. Bal- 
lew, Friday evening.

James Earl Hott of Houston 
spent the work end with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. A. O. 
Hott. lie returned his children. 
Bruce nnd Lisa, home after a 
week of visiting with their grand­
parents.

Mr. and Mrs. E.W. Barbee nnd 
children visited their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Barbee and 
Mr. and M rs.. Cecil Price at 
Quitaque Saturday night.

Mrs. A. B. Ivey, Jess Ivey, and 
Mrs. Morris Crump attended 
graveside services for a nephew,

John Thompson, at Twitty, Tex­
as Thursday.

Jennie and Jan Barbee1 visitel 
Bruce and List Hott in the home 
of their grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. O. Hott.

Mr. nnd Mrs. Hubert Mttrphreo 
nnd children of Mt. Carmel, 111., 
visited his uncle, Mr. nnd Mrs. 
Richard Dingier Monday.

D. L. Darton nnd friend of 
Borger visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Hardin Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Wylie of 
Maryville, Calif, nnd his brother. 
Mr. and Mrs. Edd Wylie of 
Pnmpa, also her mother, Mrs. 
Pearl Anthony of Clarendon vis­
ited their sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
A. B. Ivey, Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Junior Mann nnd 
daughter of Amarillo ate lunch 
Friday with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Richard Dingier.

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Sykes nnd 
daughter, Mrs. Winnett Russell 
and Viki of Amarillo stopped by 
Thursday on their way to Hous­
ton to visit their son and bro­
ther, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Sykes

BRIGHT NEWHOUSE 
P. O. BOX 671 

CLARENDON, TEXAS 
TELEPHONE 874-2001

He provides the service . . .  

the interest . . . and full 

knowledge of his profession 

to assure the right life in­

surance program for your 

needs!

/ American 
Amicable
U fe  INSURANCE COMPANY
E X E C U T IV E  O F F I C E S ,  W A G O .T E X X S

J

H E A m  a m m m m .
Complete Prescription Service

30 Daytime

PAMPERS
$ J 5 9

5-oz. Secret Super

ANTI-PERSPIRANT 
Reg. Price 99c

ASSORTED 
WALL MIRRORS

ALKA-SELTZER
25*

Reg. Price 54c
Truck Load of Zaldivar Mexican 

Hand Carved

PICTURE FRAMES 
AT DISCOUNT PRICES 

Tuesday, August 5th 
between II a.m. & 6 pjn.

Complete Lilt

HOME PERMANENT
5 1 3 0

Real Body

HAIR SPRAY
3 9  c
Max Factor

TRIED & TRUE
Protein Instant Conditioner 

for Color Treated Hair

$ 2 5 0

S2.50 Aquamarine

MOISTURE LOTION 
$ 1 2 5

NYLONS
By Comette

Unconditionally Guaranteed 
Pair

3 3 c
300 Count

FILLER PAPER
37«

CHARCOAL STARTER
Quart

2 9 c
10c CANDY BARS

7 c

Glade

Room Air Freshener
3 9 c

100 Plastic

Spoons & or Forks
3 9 c

AIR MATTRESS
With Built In Pump

$ 2 9 9

LAWN CHAIR 
$ 2 9 9

Tunnell Pharm acy
THE REXALL STORE

22 oz.

SPRAY STARCH
39
69c Melrose

HAND LOTION

fttai
10)!5ifl<■1 Or. ~

A PIRIN

c , . .

Squibb I oothpaste
Ecc nomy Size

A C ) /*

S1.00 Head & Shoulders

Shampoo in Jar
50 ‘
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Mrs. Tommy Waldrop — nee Carol Cornell

Miss Carol Cornell Weds Tommy Waldrop 

In Church Ceremony Saturday Evening
#  #  # *  *  * *  *  * *  *  *

Miss Patricia Carol Cornell 
of Clarendon, Texas became the 
bride of Tommy Ray Waldrop, 
also of Clarendon in a eandU lit'ht 
ceremony performed Saturday 
evening, July 19, 1969 in the First 
United Methodist Church of Clar­
endon. Rev. Carl Nunn, pastor, 
officiated at the double-ring cere­
mony.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mrs. Nell Cornell and Mr. Lon­
nie Cornell, both of (_'l0nmi<pi 
The groom is the son of Mrs. 
Raymond Waldrop of Clarendon 
and the Late Mr. Waldrop.

Vows were exchanged against 
a background formed by three 
tapered candelabra, votive lights, 
and greenery. Greenery and 
chrysanthemums entwined the 
candelnbra. Pews were marked 
by white satin bows.

Mrs. Raleigh Adams, organist, 
presented a nuptial prelude, the 
traditional wedding marches, 
and accomiKinied Paul Hnneoek, 
soloist, who sang "Twelfth of 
Never."

The bride, given in marriage 
by her father, wore a formal 
wedding gown of bridal satin 
covered with nylon organza 
fashioned along empire lines. 
The trim of seed pearls and lace 
extended from the neckline to 
the hemline of the train. Her veil 
of nylon organza was attached to 
a headpiece of lace covered 
with seed pearls and she carried 
a bouquet of white roses centered 
with un orchid. All of the tradi­
tions of something old, new, bor­
rowed, and blue were observed 
including a sixpence in her shoo 
sent her by Miss Janice Riley 
from London.

Attending the bride as maid of 
honor was her sister, Miss Di­
anne Cornell. Bridesmaids were 
Miss Beth Waldrop, sister of the 
groom. Miss Carol Chamberlain, 
and Mrs. Sandra Cobb, aunt of 
the bride. These attendants wore 
formal empire styled dresses ot 
peach bridal satin covered with 
Chantilly lace accented by 
large satin bow to the nark. 
Headpieces were large satin 
bows of matching color. Each 
wore a single strand of pearls 
and carried a single long-stem 
med white rose.

Cara Cornell, cousin of the 
bride was flower girl. She was 
dressed as other bridal attend­
ants and carried a basket oi 
flower petals. Miss Lynna Carter 
presided at the guest book.

The groom was attended by 
Lloyd Lynn McCord of Houston, 
Texas, best man. Groomsmen 
were Wes Henson of Clarendon, 
Troy Sublet! and Donnie Helton, 
both of Lubbock. Serving as ush­
ers were the groomsmen. Ring- 
bearer was Bill Clarence Cor­
nell, cousin of the bride, 
p 'o r  her daughter's wedding, 

s. Cornell chose a pale aqua 
piece knit with white acces­

sories. Mrs. Waldrop, mother of 
the groom wore a yellow two- 
piece knit with white accessories. 
Each wore a corsage of orchids.

Following the ceremony, a re­
ception was held at the home of 
the bride’s mother, Mrs. Nell 
Cornell. The table was laid with 
a white linen cutwork cloth ac­
cented to the center by a sterling 
candelabra entwined with ivy 
Sind bearing tall white tapers. 
Appointments were silver and 
crystal. The tiered wedding cake 
featuring an entirely white de­
cor of rosebuds was topped with 
u miniature bride and groom. 
Miss Jeri Jackson of Amarillo, 
cousin of the bride, and Mrs. Don­
nie Helton of Lubbock presided.

For the wedding trip to points 
in Colorado Mrs. Waldrop chose 
a costume suit with a gray knit 
shift dress designed with a roll 
collar and a matching gray and 
white coat complimented by 
white accessorius and the orchid 
lifted from her bridal bouquet.

The couple will be at home in 
Lubbock. Mrs. Waldrop is a 1967 
graduate of Clarendon High 
School, attended Clarendon Col­
lege a year and Texas Tech a 
year. She is now employed with 
Plains Textile in Lubbock. The 
groom graduut(*d from Clarendon 
High School and attended Clar­
endon College two years and 
Texas Tech one year. He is cm 
ployed at Tech Experimental 
Station this summer. He plans to 
continue his studies ut Texas 
Tech this faB.

The rehearsal-dinner was host 
ed by Mrs. Raymond Waldrop, 
mother of the groom, and was 
held at Mrs. Bromley's Dining 
Room Friday evening. July 18. 
Tables were laid w ith white Uncfi 
cloths and Centered with J*>neh 
mums accented by candles. 
Twenty attended.

Miss Carol Chamberlain and 
her mother, Mrs. Fred Chamber- 
lain, entertained with a bridal 
luncheon at 11:30 a.m. Saturday, 
July 19, in the Chamberlain 
home. Favors were peach chrys­
anthemums centered with a but­
terfly. Centering the luncheon ta- 
blr was an arrangement of peach 
chrysanthemums in a sterling 
compote. Attending wore the 
bridal attendants and Miss Cor­
nell.

MRS. G. W. ESTLACK. SOCIETY EDITOR 
-----  PHONE 874-3806 OR 874-2043 -----

BRIGHTEN OLD BRASS 
HARDWARE WITH SUDS

To remove dirt and tarnish 
from old brass hardware, un­
screw it from the furniture and 
brush-scrub it with salt and vin­
egar (mixed in a ceramic dish). 
Them wash it with soap or deter­
gent suds, rinse and wipe dry. 
The next step is to oil the screws 
and re-attach brass to the furni­
ture. This advise is from Linda 
Jacobsen, Extension home man­
agement specialist.

Myers-Drum Vows 
Exchanged Sunday, 
July 20 In Hedley

Wedding vews were exchanged 
at the United Methodist Church 
In Hedley, Texas Sunday after­
noon, July 20, 1969, uniting in 
marriage Miss Pamela Ruth 
Myers of Hedley and Kenneth 
Drum of Lubbock. Texas. The 
Rev. Billy Wilson officiated at 
the double ring ceremony.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mrs. Hazel Myers of Hedky and 
the late Johnny Myers. Parents 
of the groom arc Mr. and Mrs. 
Lewis Drum, also of Hedley.

The altar was marked by a 
lighted cross in the background 
and was banked with greenery 
and accented by two large bas­
kets of white and pink gladioli.

Mrs. Don Springer, organist, 
presented a prelude of wedding 
selections and accompanied Mrs. 
Shirley Crow and Mrs. Rose 
Younger of Lubbock who sang 
a duet.

The bride, given in marriage 
by her brother, Maurice Myers, 
wore a dress of Chantilly lace 
over brocaded satin. Her bubble- 
style veil of illusion was attached 
to a tiara of seed pearls and she 
carried a bouquet of pink sweet 
heart rosebuds atop a white Bi­
ble. All of the traditions of 
something old, new, borrowed, 
blue and a sixpence In the shoe 
were observed.

Maid of honor was Miss San­
dra Winn. Miss Jcane Winn was 
bridesmaid. They wore pink 
street length shifts with white 
accessories and corsages of pink 
carnations. Mrs. Shirley Crow of 
Amarillo presided at the guest 
book.

Best man was Billy Drum, 
brother of the groom. Don 
Younger of Lubbock, uncle of 
the bride, served as groomsman. 
Ushers were Danny Drum and 
Terry Drum.

Mrs. Myers chose for her 
daughter’s wedding a blue ribbon 
knit dress with black accessories. 
The groom's mother wore a blue 
knit dress with blue accessories 
and each wore a corsage of 
white carnations.

Fallowing the ceremony a re­
ception was held in the church 
hall. The table was laid with a 
lace cloth over pink and accented 
by a floral arrangement of pink 
roses and white daisies. The 
wedding cake was decorated in 
pink and topped with a miniature 
bride and groom. Appointments 
were crystal. Mrs. Don Younger 
of Lubbock served the cake while 
Katheryn Younger of Canyon 
dispensed punch. Other members 
of the housoparty included Mrs. 
Willie Johnson, Mrs. Mabel 
Bridges, and Mrs. Dorothy Brin­
son.

As a traveling costume, Mrs. 
Drum chose a pink knit shift 
with white accessories and the 
corsage lifted from her bridal 
bouquet.

After a short wedding trip the 
couple will be at home in Lub­
bock. Mrs. Drum is a 1969 grad­
uate of Hedley High School. Mr. 
Drum is a 1968 graduate of Hed­
ley High School and Is employed 
Ify G A M Plumbing Co. of Lub­
bock.

Word-Boone 
Wedding In Canyon 
Is Announced

Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Christal of 
Clarendon, Texas announce the 
marriage of their daughter, Jan 
Christal Word, Canyon, Texas, to 
John Boone also of Canyon, in a 
double ring ceremony at the 
First Methodist Church in Can­
yon Thursday, July 3, 1969. The 
Rev. Straus Atkinson officiated.

Mr. Boone is the son of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Boone of 
Amarillo, Texas.

Members of the immediate 
families and close friends attend­
ed.

The couple will be at home in 
Canyon.

Miss Hopson Of 
Dimmitt Weds 
Ronnie Owens

The First Baptist Church of 
Dimmitt, Texas was the setting 
for an impressive ceremony 
uniting in marriage Miss Susan 
Marie llopson, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. V. C  Hopson of Dim­
mitt, and Ronnie Owens, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. V. J. Owens of 
Hereford. Double ring vows 
were read by Dr. Raymond Per­
kins, pastor. Saturday evening, 
July 19. I960.

Tall white tapers burning in 
candelabra and arrangements of 
daisies formed the background 
for the nuptial ceremony. Along 
the bridal aisle were satin bows 
marking the pews.

Miss Janice Kay Mooney of 
Dimmitt presented the program 
of nuptial music.

Given in marriage by her fath­
er, the bride wore a gown of 
Chantilly lace and organza. 
Chantilly lace trimmed with seed 
pearls accented the yoke of the 
redingote front which revealed a 
demifit A-line gown of organza 
over taffeta with a lace cage ef­
fect sweeping to a full Watteau 
train. Her butterfly veil of silk 
illusion fell from a pearl and 
crystal encrusted Chantilly lace 
coif.

Miss Cindy Hopson was her 
sister's maid of honor and 
bridesmaid was Mrs. Gary Lee 
Engman of Lubbock, cousin of 
the bride.

Eldon Owens, brother of the 
groom, served as best man and 
groomsman was Key Crawford.

Junior attendants were Miss 
Lian Dishman, cousin of the 
bride, and Van Hopson, brother 
of the bride. Candles were lighted 
by Chip Dishman, cousin of the 
bride.

V *  bride is a graduate of 
Diiiimitt High School and at­
tended Hardin Simmons Univer­
sity. The groom attended Here­
ford High School and West Texas 
State University.

Among the out-of-town guests 
for the wedding were the bride’s 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Jewell of Hedley, and her great- 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. N. 
C. Hopkins of Hobart, Oklahoma. 
Others Included Mr. and Mrs. 
Stan Sigman of Lubbock, Mr. 
and Mrs. Paul Dishman of Dal­
las, Mr. and Mrs. James Autry 
of Rockyford, Colorado, Miss 
Myrtle Reeves of Hedley, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Barton Prcstedge 
of Olton, Texas.

Botanically speaking, the tomo- 
to is a fruit, says Extension food 
and nutrition specialists. But. 
legally, it is a vegetable, accord­
ing to a 1893 Supreme Court rul­
ing.

Shower Compliments 
Miss Pam Myers 
At Hedley Saturday

Miss Pamela Myers, bride- 
elect of Kenneth Drum, was hon­
ored at a miscellaneous shower 
in Fellowship Hall of the United 
Methodist Church in Hedley Sat­
urday afternoon.

Guests registered at a table 
decorated to correspond to the 
refreshment table carrying out 
a pink and white decor. Miss 
Sandy Wynn presided. The pink 
and white decor at the refresh­
ment table was accented by 
crystal appointments. Miss Van­
essa Myers, sister of the bride- 
elect, served the guests, t

Gifts were displayed on tables 
by the bride-elect assisted by her 
mother, Mrs. Hazel Myers, and 
Mrs. Freddy Watt. In the array 
of beautiful gifts was a setting of 
stainless silverware, a gift from 
the hostesses.

Hostesses for the courtesy were 
Mesdamos Roy Jewell, A. B. 
Spalding, Henry Moore, Ray Alt­
man, R. A. Shaw, Clifford John­
son. Billy Wilson, J. D. Skaggs, 
J. M. Dickson, Hobart Moffitt, 
Freddy Watt, Don Altman, Edna 
Wilson, Dudic Messer and Jack 
Stafford. Rep.

ASHTOLA NEEDLE CLUB
The ice cream supper planned

by the Ashtola Needle Club had 1 
to be postponed and has been set | 
for Friday night, July 25 at th e ! 
center. Everyone come. Bring | 
cake or cream.

Mrs. Freddie McAnear - -  nee Patsy Lynn Murdock

Murdock-McAnear Nuptials Read 

In Memphis Ceremony July 12
*  *  *

Miss Patsy Lynn Murdock of 
Memphis, Texas and Freddie 
Clark McAncar of Clarendon, 
Texas exchanged nuptial vows in 
a ceremony at the Travis Baptist 
Church, Memphis, Texas, Satur­
day evening, July 12, 1969. Rev. 
J. W. Reynolds of Henderson, 
Texas read the double ring vows.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Delbert High­
tower of Memphis. Parents of the 
groom are Mr. and Mrs. J. G.

*  *  **  *  *  *  #  +
McAnear of Clarendon.

The altar was centered with an 
archway entwined with greenery 
and daisies and topped with a 
cluster of white wedding bells. 
Tiered candelabra and baskets of 
white gladioli against a back­
ground of greenery completed 

| the decor. Pews were marked 
| with white satin ribbon. Tapers 
| were lighted by Jerry Don and 
I John Carroll Murdock, brothers 
j of the bride.

A nuptial prelude was present­
ed by Miss Sandy McQueen, or­
ganist. who alw  accompanied 
Jimmy Stewart, soloist, as he 
sang "Twelfth of Never.” 
"More", and 'TU Walk Beside 
You." Miss McQueen also pre­
sented the traditional wedding 
marches.

The bride, given In marriage 
by her stepfather, wore a prin­
cess style gown of white penu 
de soie. The long, set-in sleeves 
were appUqued with daisies at 
the wrist and dairy appliques 
circled the jewel neckline. A 
contour daisy belt spanned the 
back camouflaging a train of 
matching fabric dotted with 
Venice lace appliques. Her fin­
gertip veil of illusion was at­
tached to a Venice lace pillbox 
and she carried a bouquet of 
miniature white rosebuds encir­
cling a cymbidium orchid atop 
a white Bible. The bride carricl 
out all of the traditions of some­
thing old, new, borrowed, blue, 
and a sixpence in her shoe.

Maid of honor was Miss Jeanie 
Anthony, cousin of the bride. 
Other bridal attendants were 
Mrs. Jimmy Neighbors of Waco, 
Texas and Miss Susan McQueen 
of San Marcos, Texas They 
ware dresses of niie green silk 
shantung fashioned along prin­
cess lines with a bow to the back 
flowing into a panel train. Head­
pieces were bows of matching 
fabric and ear'.i carried a nose­
gay of white Shasta daisies with 
white satin streamers. Flower 
girls, Jan and Jeanine Matthews 
of Albany, nieces of the groom, 
were simillarly attired. Miss 
Sandie Jones of Amarillo, cousin 
of the bride, presided at the 
guest book.

Attending the groom as best 
man was Jim Neighbors pi
Waco. Groomsmen were Ronnie 
McAnear, brother of the groom, 
and J. G. McAnear, father of the 
groom. Serving as ushers were 
Troy Sublet! of Hereford and 
Dwight McAnear, brother of the 
groom.

Mrs. Hightower, mother of the 
bride, wore a navy blue and 
white three piece knit suit com­
plimented by navy accessories. 
Mrs. McAnear, mother ot the 
groom, wore an apricot sheath 
dress with black patent acces­
sories. Each wore a corsage of

At tike reception following the 
ceremony the refreshment tabic 
was laid with a tiered cloth of 
white dotted swiss with over­
skirt accented by a floral arrang- 
ment of white Majestic daisies 
interspersed with white Shasta 
daisies in a silver epergne ac­
cented by candelabra with green 
tapers. The tiered wedding cake 
waa decorated with yellow rose 
buds. Appointments were silver. 
Presiding were Mias Diane 
Brown and Mias Pat Floyd. Also 
included in the houseparty were 
Laura Sue Mow of Memphis and 
Betty McDonald of McLean.

As a traveling costume to 
Carlsbad, New Mexico and other 
points of interest in New Mexico, 
the bride chose a three piece 
yellow suit accented by the or­
chid lifted from her bridal bou­
quet.

The bride is a 1966 graduate of 
Memphis High School and Jessie 
Lee’s Hair Design Institute and 
attended Clarendon College. The 
groom is a 1965 graduate of 
Clarendon High School. He at­
tended Clarendon College and is 
attending Texas Tech. He is 
presently employed with Conley, 
Peters ft Smith in Midland.

The couple will be at home at 
707 North Carrizo St., Midland, 
Texas.

Mr. and Mrs. J. G. McAnear 
hosted the rehearsal dinner at 
the Big O Restaurant in Mem­
phis the evening of July 11. 
Twenty-six were present.

GOVER LEMONS VOWS 
EXCHANGED RECENTLY

Miss Joan Gover and Bobby 
Lemons were married Wednes­
day, July 16, 1969, In Canyon, 
Texas.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. A. W. Gover of 
Earth, Texas. The bridegroom's 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. G. C. 
Lemons of Colorado City, Texas.

After a  honeymoon trip to 
points of interest in Colorado, the 
couple will make their home in 
Clarendon where Mr. Lemons 
will continue his coaching duties.

Free Enterprise is looking on 
a policeman as someone to pro­
tect you; a judge as friend to 
help you.

JOHN’S
L ast 3 D ays o t J U L Y

Rep.

Freedom is an Air Force pilot 
circling his downed buddy and 
totally jargettmg his own life.

ALL LADIES’ SUMMER

Dresses & Suits
N o w  R ed u ced

50%
SPECIAL GROUP LADIES’

Slacks
(Over 100 Pairs to Choose From)

H alf P rice
JANTZEN SWIM SUITS REDUCED 1 3

JOHN’ S
No Approvals -  Return*, Please________
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ENGAGEMENT
ANNOUNCED

Mrs. Mary Ann Riloy of Amar­
illo, Texas and Mr. J; D. Itiley 
ol Leila, Lake, Texu. announce 
the engagement of their daugh­
ter, Vickie Lynn, to Steven Wes­
ley Smith of Amarillo, son of 
Mrs. Joan Lumpkin of Amarillo 
and Mr. S. J. Smith of Ualhart.

The September 12, 1969 Wed­
ding will be solemnized in the 
First Baptist Church Chapel in 
Clarendon, Texas.

NEW ARRIVAL
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Lamber- 

son are the parents of a baby 
daughter, Jill Genecc, weighing , , .
6 lbs. 13* oz„ born Monday. I : ^
July 21, 1969. Grandparents are
Mr. and Mrs. Karl Barker and ? ' nvf r’ Colo-: Mr Jo'mson ami

V. U STEPHENS HOLD 
FAMILY REUNION
‘..The .Stephens family .held their 
reunion at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs, ,V. U. Stephens during the 

| \mai . week. Approximately 75 
relatives and friends were pres­
ent.

Atteudhig were Mrs. Doris Mc- 
Klnstry, Roger and Susie and 

i Mrs. Mary Nell Bledsoe and 
i Lynn, id! of Pc rote, Ala.; . Mr. 
j and Mrs. Don Stephens, Mr. and 

Mrs.. Loyd Stephens and son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Stephens and 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. Tony 
Stephens, Mr. and Mrs. Kddie 
Davis and children, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Stephens and children 
all of Pampa. <, i,

Others pn sent were Mr. and 
Mrs. H. E. Davis, Lake Jackson, 
Mr. Hnd Mrs. 11. E. Davis and 
Steve, Jim Lindsay, Patti Grey, 
Jimmie Neeley, and Mrs. Mary 
Linviilc, ull ol Wellington; Mr. 
und Mrs. Travis Knox and sans 
cf Claude; Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Black and sons of Dalhart, Mr. 
;uid Mr;,. Connie Davis a n d su i 
of Odessa; Mrs, Mary Ragsdale 
and Gerry, and Gail Pinyon, all 
of Dumas., • , , ., ,

Also attending were Mr. and 
Mrs. Dill Jenkins and sons of 
Bay City, Fred Roland, Dave 
Notz, Mr. and Mrs; Bob Vaughn, 
Suzzif' and Cindy, and Mr; and 
Mrs. C. J. Lance and son of 
Hereford; Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie

E.
Edmondson and childtvn of

Mr. and Mrs. Krnest Lamberson 
ol Groom. Clarendon aunts of 
Jill are Mrs. Bill Mooring and 
Mrs. Doyce Graham.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyce Gruham 
and Mike visited relatives in 
Lubbock Sunday and also came 
by Sunday night and visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Graham and 
family at Halfway. Crops are 
line in that area.

Mr. Scott of Clarendon; and Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Davis and children 
of Burkbumett. Rep.

Sardines aren't really sardines 
at all, according to Extension 
home economists at Texas A&M 
University. The fish is an At­
lantic herring, one of the most 
abundant and important food 
fish ifi the North Atlantic. Sar­
dines will be plentiful during 
ftlay.

May Take Drip Out of Drip- 
Dry Cottons — A new chemical 
finishing process for durable 
press cotton garments has been 
announced by the U. S. Depart­
ment of Agriculture. The process 
imparts to cotton fabric the ca­
pacity to dry smoothly when 
hung on a line while dump, after 
the spin-dry cycle on the wash­
ing machine, instead of dripping 
wet after the rinse cycle. It's 
known as the “mild-cure'* pro­
cess.
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ENGAGEMENT
ANNOUNCED

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Crawford, 
Clarendon. Texas, announce the 
engagement and approachnig 
marriage of their daughter Pam- 
ella Dewieoe, to Frank- Wade 

■ too of Mr. and Mrs. E T. 
of Turkey, Texas.

: ,A kite August wedding is plan-

Kecp your tape measure neat 
by winding it on an empty adhe­
sive tape spool and using the
coyer as a cap. . „  ..

T»C> '» ; -----------------------
MOFFET REUNION HELD 
HERE SUNDAY

The Moffett family held their 
annual reunion Saturduy and 
Sunday, July 19-20 at the Ashtola 
Community Center. Attendance 
was exceptionally good with only 
some eleven members of the fam­
ily unable to attend. Everyone 
enjoyed a good time together.

Here for the occasion were 
Mrs. J. W. Moffett, Mr. and Mrs. 
Virgil Adams and Ruby Nell, Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Adams and four 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Red Arch­
er and three children, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Gordon Adams of Plain- 
view; Mrs. Ray Brodgen and 
four children. Mr. and Mrs. Far­
ris Seaton and three children, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Seaton, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Claude Moffett 
and six children, all of Amarillo.

Others present were Mr. and 
Mrs. James Moffett and two 
children of McLean; Mr. and 
Mrs. Troy Moffett and two child­
ren of Lake Charles, La.; Mr. 
and Mrs. Hubert Moffett, Odell 
and Sharon of Tulia; Mr. and 
Mrs. Royce Moffett and four 
children of Springfield, Colo.; 
and Mr. and Mrs. Travis Muia- 
nax and four children of Pri­
chard, Colorado.

Attending from Clarendon were 
Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Moffett, and 
Curtis Moffett. Guests for the oc­
casion were Mrs. Tom Sullivan 
of Clarendon and Bro. Joe Moore 
of Borger.

Salad Dressing
Assorted Flavors 

8 os. Bottles

3 For $ 1 0 0

Johnson's

Pledge
Furniture Polish 
7-os. Aerosol Can

6 9 < s

Biscuits
Shurlrosh Buttermilk 

or Sweetmilk

13 Cans $ i e o

J ergons Extra Dry

Skin Lotion
Reg. $1.25 Size

9 8
Johnson's

KLEAR 
FLOOR WAX

REFRIGERATOR-FREEZER
e  Roomy 14.1 cu. ft. capacity with 105-lbs 

* ‘zero-degree' ’ freezer
•  True No Frost. . .  so you’ll never 

have to defrost
•  Sturdy, adjustable steel shelves
e Big-capacity twin crisper* * • , ,
e  Jet-Cold* meat pan > ' i
•  Separate ookl controls ~M-* • ' '  ll-
e Big, easy-rolling wheels
•  Door swings never a problem • . .  can be

made to open from either side ‘ Tmk.

IC E M A G iC *
automatic ice maker 
automatically replaces ice 
as you useat. And there are 
so  trays to fill ahd spin, 
no trays to pry loose!

M A N Y  M O D E L S  P R IC E D  T O  C L E A R ! 
S E E  T H E M  N O W  A N D  S A V E ! :

Household Supply Company
CLARENDON, TEXAS 

Home Owned and Operated 
Complete Home Furnishings

Demand For The 
Used Home Rises

Uxed or older homes in woll- 
maintainrd neighborhoods are 
gaining in buyer appeal because 
of limited supply for sale and 
restricted competition of new 
houses, generally priced higher.

The combination of increasing 
demand and diminishing supply 
makes the climate highly favor-1 
able for the family selling a 
home, says Jane Berry, Exten- 
sion housing and home furnish­
ings specialist. Environment al­
ways. has been an important 
factor, but it currently occupies 
Ht-parficularly prominent place in 
hrltwlirtg demand.

The average buyer of an ex­
home is often a previous 

more sophisticated than 
lUnterpart of the past, she 

Although scientific de­
velopments have increased com­
fort and rrdueed manual labor 
in the modern home, location 
continues to hold priority in 
home selection to most families.

According lo a recent report by 
the Department of Research of 
the National Association of Real 
Estate Boards, demand for older 
homes had. risen substantially in 
U  percent of the communities in­
cluded in the survey. Less than 
ten percent of the communities 
reported a decline in the demand 
for the existing single-family 
home.

The volume of used homes 
available for re-sale yvas down 
in over 30 percent of the com­
munities, adds Mrs. Berry.

27-oz. Can

8 9 c

WELCHES
GRAPE
JELLY
20-os. Jar

3 9

COFFEE CUP 
STACK MUGS

5 for

$ 1 00

the
din

Let us never forget that 
cultivation of the earth is 
most important labor of man. 
Unstable is the future of that 
country which has lost its taste 
for agriculture. If there is one 
lesaon in history which is unmis­
takable it is that national 
strength lies very near the soil. 
—Daniel Webster.

Attand Church This Sunday

CATSUP
Heinz Family Size 

20-oz. Bottle

S'
of

with the purchase 
any 4 Light Bulbs 
or Batteries at 
Regular Price

Armours Chili 
No Beans

15V2-O Z . Can

4 9

INSTANT
COFFEE
Maryland Club 

6-oz. Jar

8 9

m m m

Prices Good July 24, 25, 26
MILK 15-oz. can
Borden's Eagle Brand 3 5 '
KOTEX Box
Sanitary Napkins. Regular size 3 9

Complete Line Of

CANNING SUPPLIES

TREET 12-oz.can A ft
Armour's Luncheon Meat . W

RAID 12 oz. can
Insect Bomb. Aerosol Can 8 9
VELVEETA Mb. box S |  09
Kraft's ................................... 4 6

P R O D U C E
East Texas Vine Ripened

TOMATOES 
Lb....... 1 9
California Kentucky Wonder

BEANS 
Lb....... 1 9

California

LErru c E
Large Firm Heads

Each__ 1 9 '
Baby Green

OKRA
Lb. 2 5

California 
Long White

POTATOES
10-lb. b a g . M i

PICKLES 3 for $J^00
Alabama Girl. Hamburger Dill. 22-oz. Jars

SALAD DRESSING
Miracle Whip

Quart

VIENNA SAUSAGE 5 for 00
Wilson's — All Meat

SHORTENING
Mrs. Tucker's

3-lb. can

C o f f e e
Maxwell House 
ALL GRINDS

Pound . . . .69
BAKED BEANS
Morton House, 16V2-OZ. Cans

4 for $ £ 0 0

CAKE MIXES
Duncan Hines. Layer

3 for $ 1 0 0

NESTLE’S 1-Lb. Can ^
CHOCOLATE QUIK 2-Lb. Can

KLEENEX 4 For $ 1 0 0
Facial Tissues — 200 Cnt.—2 Ply Boxes

TEA BAGS 48-Count Pkg.
Shurfine ....................................................................................  W

AJAX
Heavy Duty Laundry Detergent

giant size

ALUMINUM
Reynolds

APPLE PIE MIX
Lucky Leaf — No. 2 Cans

WRAP Heavy Duty 4 9 *
$ |0 Q3 For

0 le i
Shurfresh C 

P h  Pure Vegetable £

J  5 Pounds
iijo o

RIGHT GUARD 1
Spray Deodorant

Reg. $1.49 Size $ J 1 9

MELLORINE 3 ^Gallon
Plains. Assorted Flavors ................

Cartons $ 1 0 0

EVERYDAY 
PAPER PLATES

100-Count Pkg. 
150-Count Pkg.

GRAPEFRUIT JUICE
Shurfine. Unsweetened. 46-oz. Cans

2 for 6 9
FRUIT DRINKS
Wagners, Quart Decanters

4 for $ 1  00

Shurfresh Vacuum Pack 
All Meat

12 oz.
FRANKS

5 3 *
BEEF ROAST

Blade Chuck
USDA Good—Lean & Tender

Lb....... 6 9

Lb.

USDA Grade "A'1

FRYERS
Extra Fancy

3 5
BACON

Wilson's Certified 
or Wright's Premium

2-lb. p k g .. $J^49 

SIRLOIN STEAK
USDA Good, Lean 8c Tender

Lb..........

BUY
SHURFRESH

MILK

C L IF F O R D S '
GROCERY & MARKET

CLARENDON. TEXAS 
MEMBER AFFILIATED FOOD

DOUBLE 
S 8c H

GREEN STAMPS 
ON

L-j
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^CLASSIFIED A D ^
All ad» are Cash with order, unless cus­
tomer has an established account with 
The Donley County Leader. Billing Char­
ges will be added on accounts under $5.00

CLASSIFIED AD RATES
MINIMUM CHARGE ..........................................  75c
PER WORD, FIRST INSERTION ......................... 6c
PER WORD, FOLLOWING INSERTIONS.........5c
PER LINE ............................................................  30c

FOR RENT
KEYS MADE 

All Kinds—WhiU You Wait 
Hanson's Goodyear Siors

ROOM AND BOARD — Rea­
sonable, also trailer park. Mrs. 
Ruby Bromley, Phone 2186.

(7-tfc)

Combine parts for the ALLIS- 
CHALMERS P.T.O. Models 60. 
66, and 72. We carry a good 
stock the year round. One new 
Model 72 and several used Model 
66 combines In stock now.

ESTLACK MACHINERY CO. 
Phone 874-2356 Box 280 

Clarendon, Texas 79226
(38-tfc)

*’CED TV SETS FOR RENT- 
Inqufre at Henson’s. (38-tfc)

WE RENT TYPEWRITERS 
at the

Donley County Leader 
Phone 874-2043

FURNISHED APARTMENTS for 
rent. C. W. Bennett, Phone 874- 
2344. (27-tfc)

Identify Your Boat with Reg­
ulation le tters and Numbers. 
Dii|>ont Mylar, Meet V. 8. 
Coast Guard Specifications. Now 
available at the Donley County 
frailer.

FURNISHED Apartments for 
rent. Bills Paid. Pud Bain, City 
Drug, Phone 874-2332 Day; 874- 
2352 Night. (3-tfc) FOR SALE—3-bodroom Home, 

comer lot 317 W. 4th. Phone 
874-2162 or see VV. J. Lowe.

(26-lc)4

KENT YOUR TUXEDOS for all
formal occasions at JOHN'S.

(12-tfc)
FOR SALE — Bennett Breath­
ing Machine. Mrs. Victor Smith, 
618 Johns Street, Phone 871-2200.

(17-tfc)

FOR RENT — Two Unfurnished 
5 room apartments. Mrs. Homer 
Estlack, Phone 874-3560 or 874- 
2356. (14-tfc)

ADDING MACHINE 
RIBBONS FOR ALL TYPES 

OF ADDING MACHINES 
Fresh Stock 

Donley County Loader 
Phone 874-2043

FOR RENT — Furnished Apart­
ments 216 E. 4th. Mrs. Estal 
Clark. (24-tfc)

FOR SALE
FARM 4- RANCH Bookkeeping 
Systems now available at the 
Leader Office. Also General 
Bookkeeping systems. Govern­
ment approved.

FOR "a job well done feeling” 
clean carpels with Blue Lustre. 
R e n t  electric shampooer $1. 
Goodman Furniture.

FOR 5?ALE — Registered Angus 
Herd Bulls. Contact Allen Est- 
lack, Hedley, Texas, Phone 
856-2501. (21-tfc)

WANTED
WANTED—Used Salad Machine. 
Write Box 91, Claude, Texas.

(27-p)

WANTED—Lawn Mowing. Call 
874-2567. (28-p)

WANTED—A woman or couple 
to care for an aged couple in 
their home in Hedley. Call 874- 
3849. (27-p)

Miscellaneous
See Johnnie Bates for your 
trash hauling.

SEE US IF . . .
You need a hydraulic hone 
made or a new fitting put on 
an old hose.

ESTLACK MACHINERY CO. 
CLARENDON, TEXAS

(14-tfc)

Let John Broadstreet repair and 
refinish furniture, sharpen hand 
saws and saw blades. Pick up 
and delivery, 6th and Carhart 
St.. Phone 874-2198. (18-tfc)

KEYS MADE
While you wait.
In Brass or Color 

TUNNELL PHARMACY

and all bidders.
Given under the direction of 

the Board of Directors of the 
Authority, this the 11th day of 
July. 1969,

Greenbelt Municipal and Indus­
trial Water Authority 

By James L. Kuhn
General Manager.

(26-2c)

Typewriter and Adding Machine 
Ribbons. Adding Machine Tape. 
All Sizes at the Donley County 
Leader office.

Before you arrange to finance 
your new or late model car, 
compare my now low cost fi­
nance rates. 1 can save you 
money. Emmett O. Simmons at 
the Farmers State Bank.

ROY M. HORN
Typewriter and Adding Machine 
repair service. Wellington, Tex­
as. Call Donley County Leader 
office regarding any kind of re­
pair service, 874-2043. (13-tfc)

FOR SALE — 1964 Fordor Hard­
top Impala with everything. Reas­
onable. John Gamer. (6-tfe)

HOUSE FOR SALE—inquire 
at Foxworth-Galbraith Lum­
ber Co. (45-tfc)

FOR SALE — CUSHMAN Motor 
Scooter. Call Bill Chilton, 874- 
2259. (21-tfc)

SIGNS FOR ALL NEEDS 
• I  the

Donley County leader 
Phone 874-20-13

BALER WIRE
Estlack Machinery Co. 

Clarendon, Texas

C,0 KART—Good Condilion, $50. 
Phone 874-3732. (29-p>

JUST ARRIVED — 100r/r Arncl 
Triacetate, Tunic Pattern-Maker 
Print to coordinate; 9 0 r/ r  Arncl 
Triacetate, 1 0 r (  Nylon to co­
ordinate; 100# Nylon Stretch 
$3 .1 9  yard; Windjamrr 98c yard. 
1 Electric Refrigerator. 1 Rc- 
cliner, Clydone's Fabrics, Phono 
871 -2330 . ( 2 7 - 1 0

Reduce Safe and Fast with Go- 
Bese tablets & E-Vap “water 
pills” . Tunnell Pharmacy. (31-p)

FOR SALE—d e a r—Nice Three 
Bedroom Home, Comer Lot. 
Clarendon. Texas, J. R. Webb. 
820 Koogle St. (36-p)

LATE MODEL 
BOAT. MOTOR 
AND TRAILER

Owner will take car or older 
fishing rig in trade, balance cash. 
See at comer Carhart and 
Browning Streets in Clarendon. 
Bill Hall. (dh)

ATTENTION: Must relocate
spinet piano, like now. this area. 
Balance may be paid in small 
monthly payments by responsible 
person. Write Mr. Jent, Box 3192, 
Lubbock, Texas 79410. (27-p)

GARAGE SALE—Beach Towels, 
Rodspreads, Drapes, Kitchen 
Ware, Decorator Pieces, Clas- 
sirnl Music Record Albums, and 
miscellaneous. Friday. July 25, 
403 East 5th. (27-p)

FOR SALE—Welding Shop, 150 
(t. frontage. Highway 287. Also 
3-bedroom Brick on three acres. 
One-half mile East on Highway 
287. Bailey Estes. (27-p)

TO SELL — House to be moved 
from farm ten miles north of 
Clarendon on Highway 70 for 
$150; also Storage Tank for $50. 
Call McAfee, 874-3603. (25-tfc)

FOR SALE—4-bedroom Brick
Homo, 39 ft. Don, New and Mod­
ern. J. T. Moreland. Corner 
West 6th & Johns. (29-p)

MRS. TRUETT HALL

INCOME TAX SERVICE 
BOOKKEEPING

Located East of 

Court House Square

CLARENDON, TEXAS

FOR SALE—2-bedroom, furni­
ture and all, close in, $4,950 
One 2-bodroom close in, $4,995; 
One 3-bedroom West part, $6,500; 
One 2-bedroom West part, will 
finance; One 2-bedroom close in 
reasonable down payment; One 
2-room, large lot, $4,000 cash; 
One small house to rent near 
college; One large 2-story, good 
condition, reasonable; O ne 
2-bedroom West part, $4,750 John 
Garner, Phone 874-2330, Claren­
don. Texas. (27-2c)

BUTANE 
KOPANE.
■itt

" IfMUtt
ttoEmtfem

T ft M OIL COMPANY 
PhoM 874-2155

ARRIVING FRESH WEEKLY- 
Fresh, small cheaper Stocker 
Cattle. Also real nice cow and 
calf pairs and heavy springers. 
See, call, or write Clarendon 
Cattle Co., Inc. c/o Bill Porter, 
Clarendon, Texas, (Z7-2c)

QUALITY JOB PRINTING 
AT THE LEADER

Legal Notices

NOTICE
BUDGET HEARING 

CLARENDON COLLEGE 
At the regular meeting of the 

Board of Regents of the Claren­
don College District, held on the 
10th day of June, 1969, the follow­
ing order was passed:

“Be it ordained by the Board 
of Regents for (he Clarendon 
College District that: A budget 
hearing for the Clarendon Col­
lege District be held for the pur­
pose of preparing and discussing 
the budget for said College- Dis­
trict for the 1969-70 college year. 
Said hearing to be held at the 
school Administration Building, 
Clarendon, Texas, Donley Coun­
ty, at seven-thirty o’clock p.m. 
on the 42th day of August 1969.” 

The public is invited to attend 
said budget hearing on the above 
date.

A copy of this order, signed 
by the President and Secretary 
of the Board of Regents of the 
Clarendon College District and 
the sea] thereof hereunto affixed 
this the 10th day of June, 1969.

Bill Todd, Sec y 
Frank Phelan Jr., Pres.

(26-20

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
The Board of Directors of the 

Greenbelt Municipal and Indus­
trial Water Authority gives 
notice to bidders of the proposal 
to purchase radio communication 
equipment consisting of one base 
station and three mobile units 
and such other appurtenant radio 
equipment necessary for com­
plete radio communication from 
tile Filter Plant of Ihe Authority 
located North of Clarendon, 
Texas, to Crowell, Texas. Such 
bids shall be received at the 
General Office of the Authority 
located in the aforesaid Filter* 
Plant of the Authority on or be­
fore 2:00 o'clock P. M. on Fri- 1 
day, July 25, 1969. The mailing 
address of the Authority is Box 
665, Clarendon, Texas 79226, but 
any bids so mailed shall never 
the less be received at said Gen­
eral Office of the Authority on 
or before such date and time. 
The bids will be opened at such 
Filter Plant immediately after 
such time on such date. The 
plans and specifications may be 
obtained from the aforesaid 
General Manager of the Author­
ity at such place and address 
stated above. The Board of Di­
rectors reserves the right to 
refuse and reject any and all 
bids, and reserves the right to 
negotiate modifications of the 
plans and specifications with any

NOTICE
CLARENDON INDEPENDENT 

SCHOOL DISTRICT
At the regular meeting of the 

board of trustees of the Claren­
don Consolidated Independent 
School District hold on the 7th 
day of July, 1969, the following 
order was passed:

"Be it ordained by the Board 
of Trustees for the Clarendon 
Consolidated Indepc ndent School 
District that; A budget hearing 
for the Clarendon Consolidated 
Independent School District be 
held for the purpose of prepar­
ing and discussing the budget 
lor said school district for the 
1969-1970 school year. Slid hear­
ing to lx* held at the school Ad­
ministration Building, Clarendon, 
Texas, Donley County, at eight 
o'clock p.m. on the 14th day of 
August, 1969.”

The public is invited to attend 
said budget hearing on the above 
date.

A copy of this order, signed 
by the President and Secretary 
of the Board of Trustees of the 
Clarendon Consolidated Inde­
pendent School District and the 
seal thereof hereunto affixed this 
the 7th day of July, 1969.
Attest:

Richard Tunnell, See’y 
Warren Hardin, Pres.

<26-2c>

MARTIN NEWS
Mrs, Raymond Waldrop

Mrs. Clyde Pittman, Mr. ;uid 
Mrs. Duane Pittman and Christi 
of Stafford, Mr. anl Mrs. B. H. 
Higgins and David of Amarillo 
visited their parents Saturday 
and attended the Come ll-Waldrop 
wedding Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Rey­
nolds visiled Sunday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Delmar Koonlz and 
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Reynolds 
and family of Amarillo spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Steve

| P eo p le , Spots InThe N ew s j
HEAVIEST weight ever flown 
in plane, three-quarters of a mil­
lion pounds gross, rises in C-5 
Galaxy test at Edwards AFB, 

............................3. Calif.

NEAR MISS for Bob 
Seagren of Southern 
Cal in try at 18-foot 
vault at AAU meet in 
Miami.:

ELECTRONICS helps indoor
joggers measure speed and dis­
tance. “Slim - Master” has 
Micro Switch Jogmeter cali­

brated in steps per minute.

FORMATION “flight” of penguins across water is caught 
at Nuremberg, Germany zoo. Usually seen walking,
they’re responding to mess call I

Mr. and Mrs. Don Helton of 
Lubbock spent the week end with 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Helton.

Bro. and Mrs. Bryan Knowles 
and family were dinner guests 
Sunday of Mr. and Mrs. L. A. 
Watson and Larry.

Mr. and Mrs. Rabbitt Osbum 
and son moved from the Hom- 
mol farm house into town last 
week.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Quick of 
Clarksville visited Sunday morn­
ing with Mr. and Mrs. L. A. Wat­
son and Larry.

Johnny Spivey is home on leave 
from the U.S. Navy in Calif. He 
is visiting with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Claude Spivey and 
other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Fuston and 
family of Turkey stopped by the 
Eldon Lyles Sunday on their way 
to Colorado.

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Christie of 
Idalou and Don Jacobs of Amar­
illo visited with Mr. and Mrs. 
L. O. Christie Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Odom 
and family visited Friday night 
with Mr. and Mrs. L. O. Christie.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Edens vis­
ited Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Roland Salmon of Lesley.

Mr. and Mrs. Broadus Spivey 
and children of Lubbock, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ira Spivey of Amarillo 
and Becky Eaton of Memphis 
visited Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Spivey and Johnny.

Mr. and Mrs. G. L. Toney and 
Mrs. Gaytha Bruce of Amarillo 
attended the Comell-Waldrop 
wedding Saturday night.

Control weeds and grass in cot­
ton with chemicals. Proper tim­
ing of postemergence herbicides 
will keep cotton free of weeds. 
Fred C. Elliott, Extension cotton 
specialist, advises farmers not 
to wait too long to Ibegin a|>- 
plications even if pre-emergence 
chemicals have been used. Ho 
adds that Texas cotton producers 
have available a long list of post- 
emergence herbicides for doing 
the job and suggests that they 
visit Ihe local county ^igcnt for 
detailed information.

Leader Local Rate S4.00

FOR ANY OCCASION
Photographs 

Portraits 
Weddings 

Family Groups Or 
Commercial

Black & White Or Color 
Can

SAYE'S STUDIO
Phone 874-3844

C O N N I E ’ S
RADIO AND TV SERVICE

Ws Service All Makes 
And Models

Home
Auto

Television 
PHONE 874-3752

Next Door To Fire Station

AMERICAN
WATER HEATERS

GLASS LINED 
10 year guarantee

38 gallon ...........................  847.98
30 gallon ........................... 849-95
40 gallon .......................... 854.95
50 gallon ........................... 809-95

Natural or butane
McKECHNIE & SON

Surplus, Salvage A Hardware 
lQUi A Cleveland 373 6908

Free delivery In Amarillo
(31-P)

MADDING
EXTERMINATING CO.
Termite & Pest Control 

Home Owned A Operated 
See or Phone

BILL MADDING
For Free Estimate
802 S. Collinson

Box 354 - Clarendon, Texas
(28-p)

SAVB 
itm i«
Q U A LITY
FAINTS

Choose from our large eel 
action of ANCHOR inside 
and outside —

LATEX PAINTS
HENSON'S

Your Goodyear S tore

Reynolds.
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Cole and 

family enjoyed the day Sunday 
at Palo Duro Canyon picnicing.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Miller of 
Roswell, N. Mex. spent Saturday 
night with Mrs. Raymond Wal­
drop and Both and Mrs. Joe 
Hadder. The Millers went back 
Sunday to Dumas and visited 
with her father, L. L. Waldrop.

Mrs. Mary Myers and Ray­
mond Waldrop and Beth visited 
Friday with Mr. and Mrs. Othcl 
Elliott.

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Helton and 
Clyde Wayne, also Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Helton enjoyed a few days 
last week in Las Vegas, N. Mex.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Reid vis­
ited Thursday night with Mr. 
and Mrs. W. D. Higgins.

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Helton at­
tended the Bollard-Barrow wed­
ding in Amarillo Saturday aft­
ernoon. Barrow is a nephew of 
Mrs. Helton.

Mrs. Wayne Johnson and Jan 
of El Cajon, Caiif. are visiting 
with Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Risley. 
Mrs. Keith Schollenbarger and

children had lunch Sunday with
them.

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Holton 
visited Thursday in Memphis 
Hospital with Othcl Elliott.

Mrs. Lloyd Risley went to 
Pampa Saturday.

It
4*

DR. JACK L. ROSE

OPTOMETRIST
Phone 259-2216

415-A Main Memphis

GOOD USED 
EQUIPMENT

Forage Equipment
John Deere Hay Rake
John Deere 214 Wire Baler PTO
John Deere 14 Twine Baler PTO
John Deere 480 9’ Mower/Con- 

ditioner (new)
New Holland 9’ Mower/Condi- 

tioner (new)
New Holland One Row Harvest­

er 540 PTO
IHC No. 47 Wire Baler PTO 

(new)
IHC No. 55 Two Row Harvester 

1000 RPM
IHC No. 50 One Row Harvester 

540 RPM
Massey Ferguson No. 10 Wire 

Baler with engine
Gehl One Row Harvester 510 

RPM

TEXAS TRACTOR & 
EQUIPMENT COMPANY

901 Johnson Street 
P. O. Box 2210 

Amarillo, Texas 79105 
VAL F. DIX, Manager

TIDWELLI
C O N S T R U C T I O N In  «• /

Clarendon, Texas 
Tel. 874-2095 

CECIL McAFEE, Mgr.
PIPE LINES 

WATER LINES 
DOZER WORK 

MOTOR GRADER 
ROAD BORING 

DITCHING

PAINT SALE
(Discontinued Colors)

75 GALLONS
Up to $7.95 Value $2 gal.
50 Quarts 50c qt.

Interior Enamels and Latex 
We Feature a Complete Stock of

PAINT AND 
BUILDING NEEDS

Hlgheat (Quality A LoWWat Prices 
— at —

J & W LUMBER 
& SUPPLY

Wayne McElroy, Mgr. 
Phone 874-2000

Domestic & Irrigation

Well Drilling
Test Holes 

Pump Repairs and 
Gear Head 

Well Bailing Unit 
New Pumps for Irrigation 

and Domestic Wells — 
Submersible and Turbin 

Any Type of Well Service

A&A Drilling
Lakeview, Texas 

Ph. 867-2231
Night. Memphis 

259-3245

While You Wait at
HENSONS

Your Goodyear Store

TV Cable Service
THREE

CLEAR CHANNELS 
plus FM Music and 

Continuous Weather Scan 
On Channel 6 

For Information and 
Service Call 874-3570

CABLE TV
OF CLARENDON

RAY'S APPLIANCE 
SERVICE

General Electric 
Franchise Dealer For 

Heating ft Air Conditioning 
Sales & Service

Service All Makes 
Air Conditioning

Freezer ft Refrigeration 
Service & Repairs

PHONE 874-3801
D. P. RAY. OWNER

CLARENDON, TEXAS

ANY HOME 
CAN BE

A N  ELEC T R IC  R O O M  
A IR  C O N D IT IO N ER  

IS T H E  A N S W ER
• LOW COST TO PURCHASE
• INSTALL IN MINUTES
• LOW COST TO OPERATE

REFRIGERATED AIR CONDITIONING 
OPERATING COST 

FOR INDIVIDUAL ROOM UNITS

(Based on compiled research figures)

Cost per month
% Ton (6,000 B T U) . . . . . . . .  . $3.00-5.00
1 Ton (12,000 B T U )............... ..  a O O -10.00
Vk Ton (18,000 B T U ).....................9.00-15,00

Cost estimate based on May thru 8ept 1400 hrft 
— normal summer temperatures

I fa> F R ia lD A in a
S ftd k ft  appliances

____ -nrnanlM WTV,

FREE WIRING
FREE Normal 220-volt wiring from WTU to resi­
dential customer who purohaeee a one-ton or 
larger unit—from your local dealer or WTU.

See Ybur ELECTRIC Appliance dealer, nowf

West Texas Utilities
Company
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Otis Konntz of Clarendon s|x-nt 

Friday and Saturday with the R. 
G. Eddlemans.

O. C. Edwards visited in 
Claude Thursday afternoon.

Mrs. Ben Lovell vLltcd hi r 
mother, Mrs. W. A. Poovey, Fri­
day in Clarendon.

Mr. and Mrs. Chris Knutnat- 
chion of El Paso S[ient Saturday 
and Sunday with the Bob Row­
lands.

Mrs. Steve Donald severely 
sprained her ankle last Wednes­
day evening but reports good re­
covery although it will be about 
eight more days liefore she can 
walk on it again.

Mrs. L. S. Newberry ate Sun­
day evening supper with Mr. and 
Mrs. II. M. Horschler.

Mrs. Retta Hubbard spent Fri­
day evening in Amarillo visiting 
her daughters, Mrs. Ann Ander­
son and Mary Joyce Cory.

It was reported that Nath Col­
lar, formerly of Goodnight is now 
in Groom Hospital.

The Lynn Boomers visited their 
daughter, Ginger, and family, 
Mi-, and Mrs. Jim Kennedy and 
Kelly of Lubbock tins past week.

Mr. and Mrs. Heryal Eddleman 
of Pampa sjx-nt Sunday after­
noon in the R. G. Eddleman 
home.

Tlie Jack Merrills were in 
Claude last week attending the 
Jeff Ewing funeral.

Mrs. Alda Hudson and Mrs. 
Retta Hubbard played 42 with 
the W. M. Crains Saturday night.

Highlights
and Sidelights

From Your

State Capitol
By Vcm Stanford

This photo was taken during practice sessions at Manned Spacecraft Center, Houston. It shows the 
Lunar Module pilot Edwin E. Aldrin (left) using a scoop while Spacecraft Commander Neil Armstrong 
takes pictures. This is quite similar to what TV viewers saw actually taking place on the Moon 
Sunday night.

GOODNIGHT

NEWS
Lee Ann Palmer

Mr. and Mrs. Lyndal Carey 
and children of Claude spent Sun­
day afternoon with the Clifford 
Maybens.

Area residents attending the 
funeral of Mrs. Paul Lambert 
(Martha Jo McDowell) in Fritch 
this past week were Joe and 
Miss Mai Miller, Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Donald, Miss Inez Blank­
enship, Mrs. G. A. Blankenship, 
also Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Clack.

Mrs. W. H. Brown of Green­
ville, Texas was a houseguest of 
her sister, Mrs. W. M. Boston 
from Wednesday until Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bowley visited 
the W. M. Crains Saturday after­
noon.

Approximately 23 people enjoy- 
el the barbecue and songfest Fri­
day night at the home of George 
and Mrs. C. H. Keeter held for 
two adult classes of the Groom 
Baptist Church.

Mrs. John Luther is in Vivian's 
Nursing Home at 508 N. Taylor 
in Amarillo and would enjoy

RM SATE

Look Where You’re 
Going . . .  Look Out 
for Trouble...
One second of care­

lessness is all it takes 

for tragedy to strike.
Guard against it by keeping
all farm machinery in good, safe, working order.
When you need new equipment, consult us for a loan.

THE FARMERS STATE BANK
AND TRUST COMPANY

M em b er Federal Reserve System 
Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

- 1

hearing from her friends und 
former neighbors.

Carroll May of California is 
visiting with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee May of Tulia and his 
sister and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Hignett.

Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Clack vis­
ited the Lee Palmers Sunday
evening.

Mrs. Albert Thomas and boys 
of White Deer and Mrs. Phil 
Sandlin and Craig visited the It. 
G. Eddlemuns Friday.

Rev. O. C. Edwards attended 
tlie second session at Pan-Fork 
Baptist Encampment Monday 

j through Thursday this past week.
W. M. Crain visited his fa- 

| (her, A. M. Crain, in St. Ann's 
j Nursing Home in Panhandle Sat- 
I urday.

Mr. anl Mrs. Bobby Rowland 
of Amarillo spent Saturday and 

I Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
| Rowland along with Mrs. Row­
land's two brother’s, David and 
Skipper of El Paso.

Mr. and Mrs. C. N. Sutton took 
their grandchildren, Lisa, Penny, 
Betty and Ethel swimming in 
Clarendon Sunday afternoon.

Mrs. C. E. Willis, sister of 
Clifford Mayben, visited the 
Mayben family this week on her 
way home to Chamberlain, South 
Dakota.

Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Garland 
had Sunday night supper with 
Mr. and Mrs. Tack Moreland in 
Clarendon.

Mrs. Retta Hubbard spent this 
past week serving as Camp 
Nurse for the Pan-Fork Baptist 
Encampment returning home 
Thursday evening.

Mrs. Bill Tyler and Mrs. O. C. 
Edwards visited Saturday with 
the D. C. Pedens.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Pennock 
and three children, John, James 
and Alicia, of Fort Worth arriv­
ed Friday for a week end visit 
with Misses Mary and Mai Mil­
ler and Joe Miller.

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. McGeher 
visited the W. M. Crains Friday.

This community regrets the 
death of W. L. Dabney last 
Sunday morning. Mr. Dabney 
died after a recent surgery. The 
community extends sympathy to 
the Dabney family.

Mrs. Alda Hudson, Mrs. Retta 
Hubbard and Mrs. Mary Crain 
spent Friday afternoon with Mrs. 
Burrow of Claude and visited a 
daughter, Mis. John T. Wilson ol 
Odessa.

AUSTIN, Tex.—It starts all 
over again Monday (July 28), 
Legislators will be back at the 
capital, finishing up the finance 
chores they left dangling in their 
regular session.

Gov. Preston Smith, who called 
the special session after he re­
jected lawmakers’ no-tax, one- 
year budget and insisted on 
adoption of a balunced biennial 
appropriations bill, apparently 
will spell out his recommenda­
tions on opening day.

Smith has been conducting a 
series ol talks with business and
industry leaders, exploring tax 
ideas. Legislators arc expected 
to have to come up with a reve­
nue measure totalling $300 mil­
lion or more.

Governor abandoned the idea 
of waiting until ulter the August 
5 vote on an $80 million welfare 
spending limit and other propos­
ed constitutional amendments. 
Advisors and legislative loaders 
told him lawmakers will need 
every one of the 30 days allotted 
for the special session to com­
plete the big money job at hand.

Key legislative leaders hive 
done some spadework on a $5.6 
billion two-year budget for the 
fiscal period extending through 
August 31, 1071. No major diffi­
culties are anticipated here, al­
though some hitches could de­
velop.

Ni w court hills also are being 
drawn in preparation for spt'cial 
session effort to enact a mea­
sure to replace* the courts mea­
sure vetoed by Smith last month 
as reaching his desk too Lite. 
Courts Spe .k

A patient can still collect on a 
hospital insurance ixiiicy, even if 
most of his expenses are paid by 
Madlcare, says the State Su­
preme Court in agreeing witli the 
appellate court in an Abilene 
case.

A serum company is liable for 
damages in the death of 25 reg­
istered calves in Ochiltri e Coun­
ty, says the Supreme Court in 
backing a trial court. Court 
found that antibiotic given the 
calves for a respiratory ailment 
was unfit for use.

A Waco seed company’s failure 
to protest its tax assessment be­
fore the board of equalization did 
not deprive it of the right to 
challenge the valuation in court, 
the High Court said in a decision 
upholding the Waco Court of 
Civil Appeals but reversing the 
trial court.

Supreme Court has agreed to 
hear an application by the El 
Paso Times on a libel case by a 
former UT-HI1 Paso professor. 
Dr. Richard Trcxler claims he 
was libeled by a letter published 
in the Times. Trial court found 
no actual malice or damages, 
but the- appeals court said, the 
Jury got the wrong definition of

actual malice and ordered a re­
trial. which the Times appeal'd.

Cburt upheld an appeals deci­
sion that Deaf Smith County 
landowner Vada White and 
others would have to start ove r 
in a land condemnation suit in­
volving Natural Gas Pipeline Co. 
of America.

Dallas man, convicted of slay­
ing a school girl, got a new trial 
by order of the Court of Criminal 
Appeals, because his lawyers 
were not given an advance list 
of prospective jurors.

Court of Criminal Appeals re- 
vi rued conviction of a Galves­
ton man for possessing narcotics 
paraphernalia because the trial 
court permitted testimony on in­
formation given the police by a 
drug buyer.
Appointments

Norman F. Newton. 27 year-old 
aide to Sen. John Tower, is the 
new executive director of the 
Republican Party of Texas.

Governor Smith named to the 
new Credit Union Commission 
Wilfred S. McKinnon of Baytown. 
Unix i t W. Mitchell of Longview,

Pete G. Gixich of Fort Worth, R.
C. Morgan of El Paso. Walter V. 
Duncan of Richardson and Glenn
D. Johnson of Houston.

Smith is setting up a 27-mcm- 
ber Governor's Health Advisory 
Committee to work with the 
Texas Slate Comprehensive 
Health Planning Agency and has 
arranged a two-day orientation 
program.

Ralph Retlig of El Paso was 
named to the Texas Water De­
velopment Board to fill a va­
cancy on the Board's weather 
modification advisory committee. 
He replaces the late C. B. Ray of 
El Paso.

Governor Smith named six leg­
islators to attend the Southern 
Regional Educational Board's 
legislative advisory council meet­
ing in Hot Springs, Arkansas. 
Senators named were Bill Moore 
of Bryan, Jim Hates of Edin­
burg and Jack Hightower of Ver­
non. Representatives were Hil­
lary B. Duran of Del Rio. Don 
Cavness of Auslfi and Prank Cal­
houn of Abilene.

SEE

Pat Roberson
— lor your —

Lawn Mower and Small Engine 

General Auto 

REPAIR SERVICE

PROMPT — RELIABLE — DEPENDABLE

— at —

Estlack Machinery Co.
Your ALLIS-CHALMERS Dealer

Don’t Take 
Chances ... 
Take Care!
A safe farm is a profitable 
farm. Get the safety habit 
— harvest lifetime benefits.

Let electricity go to work for you in and around your farm. 
Do be sure the wiring is adequate to carry the load, and safely.

t y ie e d t e lt '
E le c tr icO  M ICA

P. O . BOX 9 4 8 TELEPHONES 4 4 7 -2 8 3 6
4 4 7 -2 8 3 7 i*»
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TRAFFIC LAW
QUESTIONS 

AND ANSWERS

Q. Is a driviTs license requir­
ed and whnt is I hr minimum age 
a boy or a girl can obtain a li­
cense to operate a motor scooter 
or motorcycle?

A. A drivers license IS requir­
ed to operate any type of motor 
scooter or motorcycle. Th< min­
imum age is 15 years and this 
will he a restricted license for 
operating a motorcycle which 
does not exceed 5 brake horse­
power. To operate a motorcycle 
over 5 brake horsepower re­
quires a regular license. Any 
person with the new drivers li­
cense (with color pioturel must 
take a written examination plus 
the drivers test on a motorcycle 
to operate a motor scooter or 
motorcycle regardless of horse­
power. Any one still holding the 
old type license (without pic­
ture I may still legally operate 
any type motorcycle, until they 
re-new for the now type license.

Q. Who is required to wear 
safety helmets?

A. No person may opr rate or 
ride as a passenger on a motor­

cycle on any public street or 
highway unless he wears protec­
tive headgear which has been up  
proved by the Texas Department 
of Public Safety.

Q. What should you do if you 
damage an unattended or parked 
vehicle?

A. You must locatp the owner 
if possible or leave your name 
iuhI address, name of thr owner 
of the vehicle which you were 
driving and u statement of the 
circumstances in or on the 
damaged vehicle where the own­
er will find it.

Q. How dose can or should 
you follow another vehicle?

A. The driver of a motor ve­
hicle shall not follow another 
vehicle morr closely than is rea­
sonable and prudent, having due 
regard for the speed of such ve­
hicles and the traffic upon and 
the condition of the highway. A 
good rule of thumb is to allow 
one vi hide length for each ten 
miles per hour of speed you are 
traveling.

Mrs. Chester Martin is'.visiting 
in Amarillo with her urns and 
their families and getting ac­
quainted with her new li|tle 
granddaughter, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Harold Holland. . ,

QUALITY JOB PRINTING 
AT THE LEADER

AUTO INSURANCE 
& TEENAGE DRIVERS

Parents of teen-age drivers, es­
pecially boys, should bo prepared 
to pay up to triple their regular 
rates for auto insurance.

The cost of an under 20-year- 
old boy who is the principle driv­
er of a second or third car in the 
family runs about three times the 
is registered in Ihe parents' 
name, according to an Extension 
home management specialist

The ratP Is about double the 
adult cost if lie merely drives 
the family car "with permis­
sion," Linda Jacobsen adds.

Records show that youthful 
drivers are more careful of the 
family car than their own, and 
during this period they can build 
up a good record which will be 
an advantage with later rates.

Girls aren't quite as expensive: 
a policy covering a 17-year-old 
girl as principal driver costs 
about 50 percent more than the 
standard adult rate, going down 
to 10 percent excess at age 20. 
But surveys indicate that girls 
are getting morp careless at the 
wheel thp Texas A&M University 
specialist says.

For boys, penalty premiums 
start to drop at age 20, decreas­
ing annually to 10 percent at age 
29. Miss Jacobsen adds that 
t( onagers who have taken an ac­

credited driver education course 
save about 10 percent.

Enrollment Exam For 
IRS Sept. 29-30

Those who wish to take the 
enrollment examination lo quali­
fy before the Internal Revenue 
Service may obtain application 
forms and other Informational 
materials from Richard R. 
Bishop, Examination Coordina­
tor, P. O. Box 594, Dnllas, Texas 
75221. Mr. Bishop may be reach­
ed by telephone at area code 
214-749-2795. or in room 1132 nt 
1600 Patterson Street, Dallas.

District Director Ellis Camp­
bell, Jr., emphasizes that the 
right to represent clients in tax 
and other matters before IRS is 
limited to those who meet the 
highest standards of technical 
proficiency and ethlrfl (tlnduct.

The examination will be held 
in the Dallas District Office on 
September |E) and September 30, 
1969, for IhtW 'fax practitioners 
who are not attorneys or certified 
public accountants.

Applications, accompanied by 
a fee of $25 payable to the Inter­
nal Revenue Service, should lie 
sent lo Director, Audit Division, 
Internal Revenue Service, Wash­
ington, D. C. 20224, by August 
31, 1969.

PATROL INVESTIGATES 
FARM ACCIDENTS

The Texas Highway Patrol in­
vestigate) four accidents on rural 
highways in Donley County dur­
ing ihp month of June, according 
to Sergeant Vernon Cawthon, 
Highway Patrol supervisor of 
this area.

These crashes resulted in four 
persons injured, and nn esti­
mated property dnmage of $2,-
405.00.

The rural traffic accident 
summary for this county during 
the first six months of 1969 shows 
a total of 21 accidents resulting 
in no persons killed, 16 persons 
injured, and an estimated prop­
erty damage of $13,910.00.

During Ihe first six months of 
1969 In Texas there were 1,470 
traffic deaths, or two less ns 
compared to the 1,472 traffic 
deaths for the same period of 
1968. However, if past trends 
continue the last six months will 
probably f t f  exceed ,lhe first six 
months; a**Vi matter of fact, the 
Inst six months of 1968 there 
were 2,009 traffic deaths.

The .Sergeant stated. "With an 
all time regard. * at (49 traffic 
deaths oyer the 4th of July week­
end, we are not only well ahead 
in comparison to the beginning 
of the second six months in 1968, 
but well on our way to establish­

ing a record year in 1969.

Economist Sees 
Inflation As Greatest 
Enemy of Agriculture

Farmers and ranchers, per­
haps more so than any other 
group of Texans, have a strong 
stake in seeing inflation curbed, 
believes W. E. Black, Extension 
economist in marketing, Texas 
AAM University. Texas agricul­
ture has much to gain front na­
tional policies that control in­
flation, he adds.

Inflation hits farmers and ran­
chers going and coming. It In­
creases the cost of the things 
used tto • prbdtice, and Cheapens 
the doliftrti they have left, ex­
plains Black. The Inflated dollar 
does no! go as far in buying the 
things he neddf for his family 
to live. In the meantime, farmer 
prices and farmer incomes are 
held down by heavy production.

In short, the agriculture!* pro­
ducer is caught in a fcfciHztr be­
tween the prices -paid and- the- 
prices received.

Prices of production'gncdR far­
mers use seldom decline. Far ex­
ample, prices of farrA machinery 
have risen every year since 1955. 
Prices of motor vehicles also 
rose except tor a slight dip tn

1960 and 1961, points out the 
economist.

Farm production costs have in­
creased steadily since 1953. It 
appeurs that nearly all ol the 
expected increase of $2 billion in 
farm production expenses this 
yfnr will be the result of higher 
prices rather than the result of 
greater quantities of input items 
purchased, Black noted.

Inflation nt home, he adds, also 
make it harder for U. S, farm 
products to get into foreign mar­
kets.

Therefore, Black sees inflation 
as one of the greatest enemies 
of Texas farmers and rnnehers. 
both as a henderanee to U. S. 
farm exports and as a tightener 
ol (lie cost-price squeeze.

THURSDAY, JULY 24, 1969 
AMENDMENT!—

NEW ARRIVAL
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Holland 

of Amarillo, Texas announce the 
arrival ol a baby girl, born July 
15 and weighing 6 lbs 114 ozs. 
She has been named Crystal 
Dawn. Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Jesse Vick of Panhandle 
and Mrs. Chester Martin of Clar­
endon___

Mr. and Mrs. D. M. Tomlinson 
and Phil of Bartlesville, Okla. 
visited Monday with Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyce Graham and Mile.

Looter Out-of-County Roto $ 5 .0 0

(Continued from R q e  1)

more and more people refuse to 
work who are perhaps able to 
do at least limited work yet fear 
a cut in their welfare, check.

It is recognized that we of 
America do not want to see our 
needy children hungry, our aged 
deprived of care or Ihe blind of 
our nation in need of assistance. 
There are many actual hardship 
cases where additional aid is 
desperately needed. Yet, do we 
not need to take a closer look at 
the application of the aid we 
now nre able to render and find 
some means of assuring those in 
need of actually receiving the 
aid, rather than increasing wel­
fare rolls. In every Industry it 
is impossible to find laborers and 
help needed. (Yes, I was asked 
why I worked so hard when I 
could draw welfare if I managed 
it right.)

Perhaps our forefathers had 
something when their theory was 
that "those who wouldn’t work, 
didn’t eat." Many of our child­
ren, aged, etc. never get the aid 
intended for them. What is 
your opinion. The choice is up 
to you. GO VOTE.

Next week there will be a re­
cap of the remaining four pro­
posed Amendments.

Prices Good Thursday, Friday & Saturday, July 24, 25, 28

m iir n s r m o  y o t/# M o m c M B t/r
Cash Prices Save You Money Every Day At Super Save Market

LANDERS & RAY

Gunn Bros. Stamps—Ph. 874-3546—We Deliver
CL0R0X
B leach

Gallon Plastic 59 PEPSICOLA
King Site, t  Bottle Carton, Plus Deposit

3 For $ ]0 0 VINEGAR
Church'e ...........

Gallon Plastic 59
IVORY LIQUID 22-oz. A Q e INSTANT COFFEE 6 oz. jar O A (  0XYD0L

I Maryland Club
Giant Size 79 ‘

F L O U R
Yukon’s Best

10-lb. Print Bag .............. .

B a c o n
Wright’s - 2  Lb. Pkg.

C O F F I
Maryland Club
All Grinds -  Pound..............

LE
.69

ORANGE JUICE 5 for $ f  09
Winter Gold. Frozen 6-ox. Cans mmf $139 PICKLES

Plantation Club, sot
2 For g A t e

i t . dill, hamburger slices, quart . w 1

PRESERVES 18-oz. Tumbler
Garden Club, 59c Value

MANDARIN ORANGES
White Swan ...................................

4 for $ 1 0 0  1

Lettuce Arizona — 
Large Head 1 9  | Hamburger Pound

PEANUT BUTTER 12-oz. Jar
Bama 39
DOG FOOD
Alpo — Beef. Chicken & Liver, 300 cans

4 for
TOWELS
Kleenex, Jumbo, Asst. Botique

3 For $ | 0 0

Mellorine
LANE’S -  % GALLON 

3 fo r ......................
$100

Spuds
Calif. Long White 

10 Lb. Bag

39c

PINEAPPLE
Libby's Crushed or Sliced. No. 1 Vi Cans

3 for 891
VIENNA SAUSAGE
Red Bird

8 for $ £ 0 9
BARBECUE SAUCE 11
Kraft's

l-oz. Bottle ^

Bal
Shortening 

3 Pound Can ..

ke-1Kit;e
.59

S alad  D r e ss in Garden Club

'******<  4,4
It

* • * * *44


